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Storm-slimme- d crowd honors

Post's 'year' award winners
Although a sudden winter

snowstormheld thecrowd down
to 142 undaunted citizens, the
Post namuc.r of Commerce
banquetbaturuay nigni went on
asscheduled in the junior high
gym with the following honor
ed:

Frank Runklcs, man of the
year.

Mrs. Lois Williams, woman of
the year.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Mlddleton.
farm family of the year.

The storm was so bad that
the banquetspeaker,GeorgeH.
Jordan, manager of the Cle-

burne Chamber of Commerce,
almostdidn't make it,andMrs.
Williams wasn't on hand to
receive her plaque and con-
gratulations from friends.

Jordan arrived just as the
diners were sitting down to a
Jackson Catering Service meal
of roast beef, bakedpotato, and
all the trimmings.

Due to highway conditions
there were no n

guests to be introduced.
Outgoing Chamber president

Jack Alexander turned the civic
organization's gavel over to Ed

the 1975 Chamberhead,
signifying the change of ad-
ministrations.

Plaques were presented to
outgoing directors Joe n,

Jim and Dr.
William C. Wilson. Incoming
directors Lewis Hcrron, Robert
fnv ril.tfe tfnrlmnn Wnltn.
Didway and Charles
Cook were introduced.

captured

siny

fact,

Ammons

Ammons
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Her

Bruton,

Wells,

In another changeof admini-
strations, Mrs. Marie Neff, 1974

president of the Chamber's
Women's Division, introduced

Garza pioneer
dies at age 94

Funeral services were held
Sunday at 2:30 p. m. In the
Pleasant Valley Baptist Church
for Mrs. Edith Cedcria Lewis, a
resident of Garza County since
1915.

Sherman Ervin, a former
pastor of the church officiated
with Brad Giles, pastor of the
church, assisting.

Burial was in TerraceCeme-
tery under direction of Hudman
Funeral Home.

Mrs. Lewis died Feb. 21 in
Slaton. Sho was D4 years old.
Mrs. Lewis was a charter
member of the PleasantValley
Baptist Church.

Born Edith Sparks, she was
married to the lato Sam Lewis,

tSee Kkcs Sunday,Page12)
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her outgoing officers and the
Incoming president,Mrs. Patsy
McCowcn, who in turn Intro-
duced the 197S officers.

Girl Scouts from Troop 293
conducted a flag ceremony at
the beginning of the program.

Entry deadline Saturday

for junior stock show
Judges for the Garza County

Junior Livestock Show, which
will be held here March 6, 7,
and 8, havebeen named and all
is ready for the three days of
showings for area youngsters.

Entry deadline for entries is
Saturday, according to County
Agent Syd Conner.

Judges this year will be Jim
Bob McCMullcn of Snyder in
the swine division, Fred Igo of
Sterling City In the lamb
division and Buddy Logsdon of
Littlcficld in the beefdivision.

The big auction sale, which
will conclude next weekend's
show, will be held at 1:30 p. m.
Saturdayafternoon, March 84

Rites Sunday
for Mrs. Carter

Funeral services were held
for Mrs. Etna Jane Carter at
3:30 p. m. Sunday in the
Hudman Funeral Home Chapel
with the Rev. Oscar Ncwdigger
Jr., minister of the Church of
God of Prophecy,officiating.
Burial services were held in
Terrace Cemeteryunder di-

rection of Hudman Funeral
Home.

Mrs. Carter was born April 8,
1896 in Miller County, Ark., and
was a resident of Post for 53
years. She died in her home
Feb. 21. She was a housewife.

Survivors include two sons,
Tommy Carter, Fullerton,
Calif., Ray Joe Carter, Cedar
Falls, Iowa and three daugh-
ters, Mrs. J. N. Cox. Lubbock.
Mrs. Fred Richardson,
Franklin Park, HI., and Mrs. D.
W. Rlchburg, San Antonio,
Tex. Also one brother, John W.

Pattillo, Bloomburg, Tex., and
one sister, Mrs. Joy Mitchell,
Albuquerque, N. M. and 12
grandchildren and eight great
grandchildren.

Pallbearers were Emmitt
Shedd, Bill Case, Kenneth
Bullnrd, Bill Gandy. Kcnnith
Rlchburg and Tim Pettijohn.

Th. Poit Senior Class farce,
p. m.

YEAR Mr r,H AjU- -

"farm family of the yeaf"

Photo)

Girls participating included
Jerri Daumann, Kathl Smith,
Cheryl Anderson. Vlckl Tcaff,
Tammyc Echols and Knthi
Kirkpatrick

Behind the speaker's table on
tSeeCofC banquet,Page12)

with 82 of the top animals
scheduled to be sold in the
auction ring.

This will include 18 steers,32
lambs, and 32 barrows. The
champion and reserve champ-
ion barrow, steer and lamb
must be offered for sale.

Last year's auction here
brought a new record for the
sale with $18,325 paid In
premiums for 78 animals
through the ring with every
animal offered bringing $200 or
more in premiums, almost
double the average premium of
1973.

With the floor pricesadded to
the premiums, the young-
exhibitors carriedbetween$33,-00-0

and$35,000 to the bank after
the sale.

The county agent passes
along these reminders to the
young exhibitors for this year's
show:

All animals must be weighed,
tagged and placed In pen or
stall between 5:15 and 9 p. m.
Wednesday, March 5. No
rewcightsarc allowed unless
the request is made while the
animal is on the scales.

Swine will be shown ot 7:30 p.
m Thursday, lamb judging will
start at 7:30 p. m. Friday and

(SeeStock show, Page12)

on Saturday

Post volunteer firemen in
their new red Jumpsuits with
lettering in white wereguestsof
the Post Rotary Club Tuesday
noon in City Hall for an
appreciation dinner of turkey
with all the trimmings.

Rotary President Ed Bruton
called it "Firemen'sApprecia-
tion Day "

Gene Moore, both a fireman
and Rotarian,called off the roll
of volunteer firemen and asked
each of those present to stand
and tell his length of service.

"Da Happy? Go Wacky!"

Glnr, played by Ann Mitchell, refuses to touch a

Saturday In the primary school auditorium.

v

81 strandedtravelersare
beddedin local homes

storm
in years

Eighty-on-e stranded trav-
elers,delayedhereby the worst
snowstorm In several years,
spent Saturday night as unex-
pected guests In Post homes.

Statehighway maintenance
crews,headedby Joe Williams,
maintenanceforeman, and sup-
ported by both city and county
maintainors worked all night
Saturday nightand through to
about 9 p. m Sunday to keep
highways in this area open.

Drifts of four to five feet were
encounteredalthough only a
four-inc- h snow was recorded.

A warm Sunday sun melted
mostof the snow and what was
left was goneby Tuesday

With a good rain proceeding
the cold front into Post Friday
night, official weekend moisture
for Post totaled a very
wholesome .91 of an Inch

No injuries were reported In
this area due to any accidents
caused by the slippery snow-clogge- d

roads.
Highway 84 up the Cap from

Postwas closed for a few hours
Saturday night to permit
highway crews to clear IB
stranded cars off the steep
grade so traffic could proceed.
The highway was then reopen-
ed.

The highway maintenance
shop here, which was the
headquarters for the highway
effort, had 55 stranded travel-
ers in the building at one time.

City Manager Pete Maddox
ran a "taxi service" to take the
stranded to homes of Post

tpeoplc who volunteered to put
up. unexpected guests until
morning.

Other Post folks brought
coffee and cake to the
maintenance building to be
served to the travelers.

Travelers were stalled here
from Lubbock, Dallas, Temple,
Amarillo, Denver City, Canyon,
Lcvclland, Miami, Tex., and
Liberal, Kan.

Some of the local homes
accepting the travelers Satur-
day night were those of James
Wise. Bill Franklin, Floyd
Hodges, Charlie Lincoln, Victor
Hudman, Marvin Hudman,
George Mcndicta Jr., Gene

Moore reported that the 1974

"fire year" which endedDec. 1,

1974, included 1S3 fires which
were fought by the department

74 in the city and 89 outside
the city in the county.

He said the fire prevention
record Is better to date in 1975
with only 15 fires reported in
almost the first three months.

Moore then introduced Fire
Chief Ncal Clary as "the best
fire chief any department can
have."

Clary told of the development
of the three rural pump trucks
which carry 3,400 gallons
together and also pointed out
that these low-cos- t former
army trucks are used as
backup equipment for any kind
of fire, not Just for rural range
and field fires.

He thanked tho club for the
(SeeFiremen, t'age12)

to buy
sheriff's car

The Garza County Commis-
sioners Court Monday voted to
advertise for bids for puchase
of a new car for tho sheriff's
department Bids will be
received up to 10 a. m.. March
10.

In another action, the court
voted to pay the Lubbock
Mental Health and Mental
Ketardatlon Center $38.69
monthly to pay for referrals
made to the center.

Ed Bruton's letter of resigna-
tion of the Carta County Child
Welfare Board was accepted
and Waller Didway appointed
to fill his unexpired term

The court also authoriied Jim
Ulgham. representing Blue
Cross and Ulue Shield Insur-
ance Co.. to return at 1 p m
March 10 for an open enroll-
ment date to enable other
county employes to enroll who
are not presently covered. The
coat of the insurance to the
county employe la 14.58

Post firemen guests
of PostRotary Club

here night

Worst

County

Prcvo, Bill Case and J B
Potts

The police, sheriff officers
and state highway patrolmen
aided In directing traffic and
holding up cars while the grade
up the Caprock was cleared on
US-8-

Saturday
maintenance

mainlalncrs
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ROCKET RACE WINNERS aboveare the winners and overall
winner of the Race held during the Cub and Gold
Banquet last Thursday night. Left Wade Giddens, Den 5; Felix Bustos,
Den AAassey, Den 3 and overall winner; Jeff Lamb, Den 4; and Jeff
Sharp, Den 1. (Staff Photo)See story on 3.

IN DOG CONTROVERSY HERE

Conspiracychargeis
tossedot city clods
One of thosedirty "watergate

words" conspiracy has
been thrown in the city's face
by a regional field inspectorof
the Humane Society of the
United States in the current
controversyover Post' stray
dog bounty system.

Bernard Wcller, the inspector
who was contacted by a local
group opposed to the bounty
and the city'sentire system of
handling and disposingof stray
dogs, called the local bounty
system"completely illegal,"

to Mrs. Donnle Hays,
spokesmanfor the Post group
opposed to present stray dog
handling here.

He basedthis commenton the
fact that "dogs are considered
personal property in the State
of Texas and any lime anyone
takes an animal from property
of another without permission
of that person it can be
considereda dog theft."

To go along with "dog theft"
also would be a charge of
tresspassingon pro-
perty, Wcller wrote the local
group.

As for the "conspiracy"
angle Involving the city, Wcller
said that "the bounty paid by
the city could also be brought
into these charges becausethe
bounty encourages a violation
of a Texas law and therefore
could possibly be consideredas
in "a conspiracy" with the
defendants.

Summing It up, Welter, said
the dog bounty system is illegal
"because it encouragespersons
to violate the law "

Wcller, who was sent a photo
of Post's current dog pound,
said that the pens now in use
"cannot be considered In any
way an acceptable facility for
the keepingof stray and surplus
animals."

The regional field inspector
also commentedon the method
the city used to put strays to

via carbon monoxide
gassing He went into the
technique of the d

monoxide hot box
chamber" and said only that If
tho method used here required
over three minutes to put an
animal to death It was
inhumane

Welter had numerous sug-
gestionson Improving the city's
animal control program and
commented on city ordinances
pertaining to such
pointing out sections which he
termed illegal.

Local citizens concernedwith
the city's dog will

As area roads were no
problemhere
the crews here
dispatchedtwo and
two pickups to help with the
opening of roads in the Ralls
area

They worked the weekend

Rocket annual Blue
to right,

2; Greg
page

private

death

"carbon

control,

morning

meet 7:30 p. m. tonight in the
Reddy Room and have schedul-
ed an appearance before the
city council Monday night to
seek improvement on the local
situation.

Some members of the Lub-
bock Humane Society will

JOHN BEN SHEPHERD TO SPEAK

Algerita Benefit banquet

scheduled here March 13
An Algerita Benefit Dinner

will be held in the junior high
gym Thursday night,March 13,
with John Ben Sheppcqd of
Odessa,who headedthe Texas
Historical Survey Commission
when the current state histor-
ical marker system was insti-
tuted, as the speaker.

Shepherd confirmed the
speaking engagementwith a
letter to which hepenned,"This
sounds like a great project." He

Lubbock man is
hurt in wreck

Hubert Abies of Lubbock
sufferedpossiblebroken ribs

lacerations to arms and
legs early Tuesdaymorning
when the pickup truck ho was
driving overturned on FM-651- ,

10 miles north of Post
Abies was brought to Garza

Memorial Hospital for treat-
ment and transferred later In
the morning to Methodist
Hospital in Lubbock.

Most unusual thingabout the
accident was the vehicle he
totaled - a 1950 Chevrolet
pickup, now 25 years old and
still running, up to the hour of
the accident, that Is.

Openhouse newGirtf
ScouthouseMarch
Pott's Girl Scouts are plan-

ning to open Girl Scout Week
here March 5 with a Sunday
afternoon. March 9, openhouse
to show all parents and others
the new Girl Scout House at 506
West 7th

The Girl Scout organization
a small business

building In Lubbock, had It
moved to the local site, and
remodeled and refurnished it
for Girl Scout use.

Theopenhousewill be from a

there and went back Monday to
continuehelping that hardcrthlt
snow area.

That left four trucks with
snow plows, and malntainers
from both city and county for
snow clearing of highways In
this area

Pictured den
Scout

according

problem

besides

attend tonight's meeting to
discuss building of a filtering
device for the local dog gassing
chamber

A spokesman for the group
also told The Dispatch that
bringing a vet to Post Is one of
the group's primary concerns.'

declinedany speaking fee
Tickets for the dinner will go

on sale this weekendat $5 per
plate with a crowd of 250 as the
benefit goal

All proceeds from the ticket
sale, except a reduced charge'
for the meal by Jackson's
Catering Service as its conlrnt
button, will go into the "Sayc7
the Algerita" fund which now
standsat nearly $4,000 in cash
and pledges.

Shepherd,former attorney
general for Texas, is currently):
special assistant to the prcsfr
dent of Kl PasoProductsCo ai
Odessa.

Jim Hundley, who is heading4
the effort to save at least the
front portion of Post's historic?
stone-fronte- d former hotel, told
The Dispatch this week that'
Edwin Cartwrlght. the Lubbock
engineeremployed by the cit
has concluded the building'
could be safely and structurally
"cut in two" and the bactf
portion demolished and iinulotT
of.

Cartwright was here lasiP
Wednesday afternoon for the
inspection.

Hundley said he hasno cost
estimates yet on the proposal

A new turn in efforts to save,
the Algerita came Friday when'

KeeAlgerita. Page lz

to 5 p. m March 9, according to
Mrs Patty Kirkpatrick. neigh1,

borhood Girl Seoul chalrniun.

The building committee for
the "house" included Mrs.
Carol Peppers. Mrs Noll
Morris and Mrs Kirkpatrick.

She rejKirts the seven looal
Girl Scout troops,which include
units for Cadettes,Junior Girl
Scouts und Brownies, will, uje
the new "house four dayi ami
one night each week.

ot
9

purchased
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Dispatch Editorials
Paae 2 The Pat (Tex.) Drjaakh Thws,Tea. 27, 1975

I
IVanfed: more letters from readers

The "lclters to the editor" column of any
Newspaperis alwaysassuredo( top readership
becauseeverybody likes to see what other
headershave to say.

ft The Dispatchwould like to have more and
ttnore suchletters.
H In last week's paper we had four such
betters and space requirements prevented us
irom publishing a fifth. The one left oft was
5rom Governor Briscoe on his free dini-a-lin-g

gcrvice Into the governor's office forjvoters
Ijvith problems. You'll find that one In this
vjssue.
e- It Is necessaryonce in a while to restate
&he Dispatch's policy on letters to the editor

I First off. they must be signed and the
writer's name is going to be printed alongwith

A solute to Joeand his men
$ Highway maintenance foreman Joe Wi-

lliams and his highway crew played "good
Samaritan" to a lot of highway travelers
Stranded by the surprise snowstorm here
Saturday night.
1 Of course they had lots of help from
friendly Post folks who took the travelers Into

vjheir homeswhen the snow closed the highways
tjo travel for the night, and from others who

fraughtcoffeeand cake to the highway shopto
Serve the same stranded folks who had lost a
Jot of time but not their appetites.

11. Joe and thosehighway maintenancecrews
Jiad worked part of Friday night, all day

iturday. and then when the storm set In at
lusk again Saturday night they went

ff's still 'politics os usuol1
5 The trouble with our "recession fighting"

Jpn Washington is that the order of the day is
gjitill "politics as usual."

We wonder if the United States can afford
'politics as usual" for thenext 20 months,until

fvolers choosea new president in late 1976.

We've had two weary years of Watergate
nd now we apparently are going to experience
wo more wasted years as the politicians
ockey for advantage over the woes of the
ation.

Each side blamesthe other; eachpolitician
has his own special list of guys who are to
;blame. -

Right now, country wants some

Too much VheeMy deol-l-y

The Texas Legislature this week took up a
l bill to conducta presidential primary in Texas
i In 1976 with a "winner take all the delegates"
i feature which is expected to launch Senator

Lloyd Bentson on his presidential bid.

I We read this is only a part of the Bentson
strategy. He also wants to run for another six
years in his senateseat at the same time he

J bids for the presidentialnomination,a Lah LiU.
JJustin casehe doesn't win first prtic

l It seemsto us that most folks, in and outof
Austin, ought to be a bit more concernedabout
the welfare of Texas than of Senator Bentson

; when it comes to cither political maneuver -

.j primary or a two-olfic- e race

Hi

the

T

JIM

his or her letter.
Second, The Dispatch reserves the right In

all cases to withhold the entire letter, or any
part of it, if It is generally In poor taste or
contains statementswhich this newspaper
believesare either untrue or are libelous.

Most bigger newspapers and magazine
print only a small group of all
the actual letters they receive becauseof space

So, in all cases, the long letter usually Is
passedover for several shorter ones.

The Dispatch would like to see readers
expressthemselvesto the point In 200 words or
less. That is about the length of this editorial.- JC

round-the-cloc- k on Into Sunday with their
snowplows fighting to keep the roadsopen and
rescue travelers.

Joehimself aboutmidnight Saturday drove
some23 miles cast on 380 with a can of gas for
two stranded girls and helped them on Into
Post, Mayor Giles McCrary told The Dispatch.

The highway employes stayed righton the
job until Sunday nightwhen they had most of
the highwaysopenthroughthis areaagain with
an assist from the melting sun.

This is a tip of The Dispatch'seditorial hat
to Joe Williams and his men who always are
"out there" working and helping when bad
weather hits our highways. You guys are
great!

leadership.The people want the politicians to
put politics aside, shut up, knuckle down, and
try to get this nation's troubled economy
straightenedout.

The politicians were all "home listening"
only a month ago. But they didn't listen very
well or they would have heard from the man in
the street who In 1976 is going to kick over the
tracesand kick out the "ins" unlessthey get to
work and do something and cooperate
together.

That's the messagefrom Post, and we'll
bet it is the messagefrom thousandsof other
Main Streets and sidestreetstoo. Right Mr.
Gallup?

I
It seemsto us that the senator'ssupporters

can rally behind his banner quite effectively
without making due process of law in Texas
something which would bring only laughter
from the other49 states.

It seems to us Senator Bentson would
appear more of a real presidential contenderIf
he concentratedon his presidential bid and
didn't ask for a new state law or two to gel
him over the first hurdle.

Let's face it. If Texas ever gets another
president It will be after we carefully lay to
rest our "wheeler dealer" image.

And all of this is nothing against Senator
Bentson.

Jim Strawn has purchasedall

interests in the

STRAWN - CHAPMAN

TRANSPORT & ACID COMPANY

and is continuing
operation of the under

the new of

CO.

or Night Phone Is Same: 495-242-2

New Office on clairemont Hifhway

SameEfficient Services

STRAWN
OWNER

iaaal

representative

requirements.

Announcing

firm
name

ISTIAWI RANSPORT
ACID

Day

DON COLE
PUSHER
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BY KURT E. JOHNSON
AUSTIN - It was a sultry,

summer night, and about 5.5CO

other Tcxansand I were packed
Into the west gallery of the
Statehouseon the final nlfht of
the Texas Constitutional Con-

vention In 1974
By Statute the convention

would have to end at midnight,
and the prospect of adopting a
new constitution to be submit
ted to the voters had signifi-
cantly waned.At the Cinderella
hour, most obscrvors conceded,
the state legislators who were
also the convention delegates
would be cither patriots or
pumpkins, and most likely the
latter

As it turned out, supportersof
the pumpkin theory were right.
At 9:42 p. m. Trice Daniel Jr.,
convention chairman, ordered
the assemblyto "standat ease"
for a recess, and It
was obvious that individual
atttcmpts would be made to
reverseprevious votes.The ten
minutes turned out to be
substantially longer than voiced
and it wasn't until after 11p.m.
that the prior question was
moved as a last-ditc- h effort for
another vote.

Tcxans in the gallery peered
and squinted from unorthodox
positions to count the red lights
on the board, and the adoption
was again only a few votes shy
of the needed two-third- s major-
ity. The chairman held the
voting board open until one
minute before twelve amid
chaosand cursing, but no votes
changed. And so the gavel
droppedfor the last time.

Much criticism has surfaced
since that convention and is
evident in both houses of the
current 1975 legislature along
with the residuals of personal
feelings and altered political
careers. Somelegislators favor
trying to adopt a documentand
then to submit it to the voters,
while others sec the necessity
for a totally new convention.

A key Issue in "new
convention" talk relates to
whether or not legislators
should be part of the delegation.
No one really knows for sure,
but suspicion has it that the
votersarc quite cynical about a
new convention, with the
convictionof certainty that they
arc skeptical about another one
with legislators serving exclu-

sively as delegates. Dr. Janice
May, government professor at
the University of Texas and
member of the 1974

planning committee, testi-
fied in a hearing before the
SenateCommittee on Constitu-
tional Revision on February 12,
1975, by noting that "there are
certain disadvantagesof having
the legislature as a convention
in Texas."

There are currently three
bills pending in the statehouse
regarding the Issue, and no
official committee action in
cither theSenateor House has.
been takenon them.

In the Senate, Sen. Bob
Gammagc of Houston has
introduced Bill 114 calling for
an election on August 2, 1975 of
93 delegates, consistingof three
from each senatorial district,
with the convention to begin on
September2, 1975. Bill Meier of
Euless has introduced Bill 99,
calling for an election on
November11, 1975. The election
would ask whether a convention
should be called, and if that
question passes the delegates
elected on that day would
serve Under this bill, the
convention would convene on
May 17, 1976 with 72 elected
delegates (three from each
congressional district) and 25
appointeddelegates.

In the House, Rep Ben
Bynum of Amarlllo has Intro-
duced Bill 1. which calls for an
election on January27, 1976 to
determinewhether a convention
is desired by citizens and to
elect delegatesto It, three from
each congressional district,
with noneappointed, for a total
of 72

Price Daniel Jr , gave his
testimony before the Senate
committee on February 12, and
said that the "public demand
for constitutional revision has
escalated rather than soured."

Chairman Ro-

bert S Calvert, the former
State Supreme Court Justice,
testified that he favors a
citizen s convention. Sen Ray
Farabee or Wichita Falls told
mo personally that he holds
that view, and Rep Chris
Miller of Ft Worth told me that
sheleans In the samedirection.

Of interest is the fact that the
bills proposeddo not deal with
excluding legislators as dele-
gates so if the elections
eventuate some blockbuster
contests between citlxens and
politicians could be In the
offing

Mv own prediction is that
there will be another Texas
i oniiuuiionai lonvention in
either late 1974 or earl) 19TA

and composedof more ditiiens
llwn legislators as defined ti)
election Sucha prespectshould
b enoughio dme the tahnH4a
irjn

Some sav that to make a
forgetful debtor pa up one
ttMKitd drive some nails into a
lut iree in ihe shape ot a
cross and he will tome
litis:: ne i pa. ht ik hl

RememberWhen

10 years
$o

County Sufit. Dean A Robin-

son honored by the county's
school people In recognition of
his SO years In public school
work; The Texas Historical
marker commenting the old
Llano Ranch dedicated In
ceremonyat Boy Scout Camp;
Mr and Mrs. M. J. Malouf
were hosts to tho members of
the Needlecraft Club with a
luncheon; celebrating Mr. and

CALL GOVERNOR'S OFFICE
Dear Editor:

With the growth of govern-
ment In both size and scopeof
responsibilities, public officials
arc faced with the problem of
ensuring that our citizens have
free access to the services of
Stale government. Many Tcx-

anstodayneedIhe assistanceof
State government, but do not
know how or where to receive
that help.

To help eliminate someof this
confusion, and make govern-
ment more readily available to
all of the people of Texas, I

haveestablishedthe Governor's
Citizens Assistance Line TEX
HELP which is now providing
toll-fre- e telephone access to
anyonewho needsassistanceor
information on matters involv-

ing Texas State government.
The TEX HELP telephones

arc staffed from 8 a.m. until 5

p.m. Monday through Friday,
except on State Holidays. Mr.
B. L. Parker, who Is very
knowledgeablein the operations
of State government, has been
appointedas the director of the
Governor's Citizens Assistance
Office.

I believe that this Citizens
AssistanceLine can greatly
expedite the inquiries of the
people ofTexas and make State
governmentmuch more res-

ponsive to their concerns and
immediate needs.

However, in order for this
telephoneservice to achieve its
potential, I need your help In

publicizing the tool-fre- e WATS
number in your
area of Texas.

I sincerely hope that you see
the merits of TEX HELP and
that you can properly publicize
the telephone number for the
people in your area.

On the previous occasions
when I havo asked for the
assistanceof tho Texas media
In support of State programs,
you have responded most
generouslyand I deeply appre-
ciate your cooperation.

Sincerely,
Dolph Briscoe
Governorof Texas

Mrs. Malouf's 40th wedding
anniversary! Mr. and Mrs. D.

C. Hill announce the engage-

ment of daughter. Bctfy Jo, to

James Sharp; Carolyn Car-

lisle's bcthrothal to Jerry Stone
announced.

15 IJearJ Ai
9

Two womenfile as candidates
for City Council posts, Mrs
Kathcrinc Trammcll and Mrs.
Eleanor Webb; The Post
vicinity, along with the rest of
the Southwest,shivered Into Its
ninth day of severe winter
weather; Ronnie Parker,minis-

ter of the PostChurchof Christ,
was elected president of the
Rotary Club; White River rates
for wateradoptedby city; Post
trackmen going to Crosbyton
relays; Cast for tho Junior
Class Play is Carolyn Martin,
Gary Simpson, Bltllc Lou Hill,
Jimmy Minor, Frankic Howell,
Charles Gordon, Joel Morris,
Virginia Young, Forrest Cla-bor- n

nnd Jancnc Haynle.

25 yean 49
Post Dispatch Joins Associat-

ed Press, one of only 80 In

state; 100 attend Thursday
banquet for Cub Scouts; Giles
McCrary nominated for State
Rancher Prize; Contract is let
for main street paving, bids
asked on Highway jobs In
county; 23,572 bales of cotton
ranks second high In
history; Mrs. W. II. Chllds was
honored with a layette shower
In the home of Mrs. Chester
Morris.

Graham 4-He- rs

work on booth
By MIKE MACY

The Graham 1 club met
Thursday, Feb. 20 in the
Graham Community Center.
President Vernon Ferguson,
called the meeting to order and
Bill Short led the 4-- motto and
prayer.

In place of a regular
program, the members worked
on their educationalbooth to be
displayed at the county Stock
Show and Fair, March 6, 7, and
8th.

Refreshmentswere servedby
Andy Williams and Pam Riley
to the following members:
Vernon and Ricky Ferguson,
Bobby, Mike and Sharla Macyp,
Brad and Brent Mason, Rynn,
and Kini Noi'man, Jarita'
Norman, Kelly Mason, Lisa
Cowdrcy, Belinda and Russell
Fluitt, Mark and Bill Short and
Steve White Adult leaders
presentwere Mr. and Mrs. Noel
White. Keitha Beth White was a
guest.

"What's olrm onhr.Don?"

74 bond salestotal S9i
According to County Bond mnth t.T

Chairman J B Potts. Deem
bcr sales of Series E and
United StalesSavings Bonds In
Garza county totaled $.12.I4b.oo.
Sales during 1974 amounted to
$91,4B2 00 for 70 per cent of the
yearly salesgoal of $130,000.00.

Texans purchased $i9.3to,067
In Savings Bonds during the

1974 .Nii
Dor

thirty
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In Garza County

Elsewhere in Texas,with State Tax . .

Anywhere else in U. S

Overseasto service men with AP0 number

Notice: All mail subscribers - First class mail only

on any changesof address. Papersare mailed second

you must notify us tor any changes address!

subscription.

UP TO 20
What does ttfls mean? How to expj
to and intere
people is difficult.

"" m,i,iftj
Why does an agent offer this discount? And

does it mean? What the difference? Area!

agencies
- -

State affows big strong financial

like The to deviate (discount) up to 20 i

the standard published rates-- on good quaftfied i

FOR INSTANCE -- Look at your home insurance

and if the total premium is $800.00 then fake

of this amount and $640.00 would be your preu

here saving you $160.00 and that is money.

Maryland would make less and the agent would

less commission.

YOU DAN BUY YOUR INSURANCE HERE AT TH

RATES AS ALLSTATE, STATE FARM OR ANY AG

LUBBOCK & YOU WILL GET INDIVIDUALIZED SERVs

Insurance
495-305- 3051
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themeSpace Derby The Space
Derby sonswas led by Den 4

Winner for the Rocket Unco
were judged by parents of the
Cubs and winners were Den 1,

Jpff Sharp, Den 2, Felix
tlustos; Den 3. Greg Masscy
Den 4, Jeff Lamb and YVcblocs

Den 5, Wade Glddcns. Overall
winners In the race were, first
place, Greg Masscy, who was
presenteda trophy, second
place Jeff Lamb and third
place.'Jcft Sharp.

Cubbing awards earned by
the scouts during the year were
presentedby Jack Cllncamith,
assistedby Stoncy Stnlcup
They arc: Bobcat, Jesse
Basque, Sammy Dnsqucz,
Marlln Coffee, Santos
Espanosa,Santos Gonzales,U
D. Harper, Martin Nnvarro,
Jimmy Valdcz and Felix
Bustos, new
badges;Mlchcla Valdez (for
Jimmy Valdcz); one year pin to
Mlchcal Anderson; two yearpin
to Arthur Lee Striblln, Dick
Odom, Wade Giddens and
David Howard; threeyear pin
to Eric Cravy; Wolf Badge to
Bill Black, Giles Dalby Jr ,
Kent Durcn and John Conncl,
Arrow Point to Bill Black.

Among special guestsfor the
evening were Mrs. Alma
McBridc, Mr. and Mrs. Corky
Ammons, Mr. and Mrs. Bob
Conncl and Dave Parkhill, who
conducted the closing cere
mony.

See Us

Spring Oats
Seed

Onion
Onion

Setsand
Plants

Seed

Vegetable
Seeds

-Fe-rti-Loara Fertilizer

GARZA FEED & SUPPLY

New

New

membership

For:

Potatoes

Dial 3368

3B3B
MMTMS XMC MtS

MKHAMCAl IMAKBevm PIWICTIWI

Reserve

3E3B
CWI

electric air

lwdQe for ran4l rar

swV

ttwt like havina extra car In reserve?
cost

flu,

sssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssm.

SCOUTERS WITH WINNER Stoney Stalcup, assistantleader of the cub pack,
left, Jack Cllnesmlth, cub pack leader and banquet toastmaster,center, and Dan
Lamb, right, pose with Gregg AAassey, winner of the Rocket Raceafter the Cub
Scout Blue and Gold Banquet. (Staff

SPEAKER AND SCOUT EXECUTIVE Shown
above arc David McBrlde, Post Eagle Scout, left,
who spoke at the Cub Scout Blue and Gold Banquet
last Thursday night. Right Dave Parkhill of
Lubbock, Boy Scout executive who attended the
function and conductedthe Rocket Race.

Well baby clinic
to be held today

The Well Baby Clinic will be
held today, Feb. 27 in the
Community Action Center at

Pint St., from 2 to 4 p. m.
The clinic is for children' up to
school age with Immunisations
required state school
entranceavailable.
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Mechanical

INSURANCE COVERAGE
How To Get An Extra Car In

(36 Months

or 36.000 Miles) Mechanical Insurance
Coverage

Insurance Agency now offers new car buyers a

and replacementof specified major parts of the

system and conditioner.
t iiI' Your car is Inooerative overn aht or longer a resu i

wtoiinnn a ria n ccn nn in anw nnp npriod (exclusion
chflrniac nf

an
Is reasonable:

m

by the for

as

mil rnuoM . iir f nl.t. fnmak nr Actfd
l5.W dluctibk) for 34 months or 34,000 miles

'wS.w deductible) for 34 months or 34,000 miles
lull I . - . i l TT nf ralta

"yl (S25.M Deductible) for 34 monthsor 34,000 miles
mm ii.i 1 1 . . .UAmmJa

m deductible)fer 34 months or 34,000 mites
.must be mirrhaBri uiiihin "wi Hnvs of purchasedate of
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Da, j new car or picKup, any maKe or mow V" i'v;Insuranm Ananru Inr nnw 36-3- 6 Mechanical
ff?. Coverage policy. We are the only agent In most

this new Dolirw annther first for Post Insurance.
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Studentsinto
honor society

Three studentsfrom WTC,
former graduatesof Post High
School, Jan Burkctt, Judy
Hclntz and David Posey have
been initiated Into the Psi Zcta
Chapter of Phi Thcta Kappa.

Founded in 1918, Phi Theta
Kappa is the scholasticsociety
of two-yea- r colleges in the
United States.Studentsmust
have a minimum grade point
average of 3.2 to be eligible for
membership.

JanBurkett, is a freshmanat
WTC and is a secondary
education major. She is the
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jack
Burkctt of Route2, Post, and a
graduate of Post High School
where shewasa member of the
National Honor Society.

Judy Hcintz, also a freshman
at WTC, Is an elementary
education major and was
graduated also from Post High
School. Sheis the daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Heintz of
Post.

David Posey is a freshman
engineering major and is a
graduate of Post High School.
He is the son of Mr. and Mrs.
Gene Poseyof Post.

Cooperation is doing with a
smile what you have to do
anyway

PAY BILLS
To Enjoy Continued

CREDIT
The credit bureau's mcii- -

age to me consumer is
simple. Pay promptly. Spell-

ing It out clearly never let
an account go pan due
without payment or Immed
iate contact with the creditor

Never allow an account to
become an item charged off
to profit and Iocs, This means
that the merchant has given
up hopes ot coUcting and
has changedyour account
from an aMet to an expense
item, The ltm ! automati-
cally recorded In the files of
the credit bureau. There it
cannot be changed or altered
unlesssubsequentdealings
with the same firm results In
a better record,

Never allow en account to
be listed Ii the collection
department Jf the credit
bureau, Payments In full will

result In better credit re-

ports, but the Item must
remain on file for many
yearsto come perhapifor
the rest of your life.

Your credit record Is a
picture of your characterand
has been found to be an
extremely accurateguide to
your future actions, particu-
larly pertaining to whether
you will pay future contract!
anddebts,

Keep your picture bright
andsiUnlng and enjoy all the
conveniencesof the machine
age You can cut olt the
advantages olcredit buying
by disregarding or Ignoring
warnings of your merchant
friends

Ketall Merchants
Credtt tvreeu

tas men complete
electrical course

Gene Moore and Charlie
Cooper of Post were among
recipients receiving certificates
of achievementawarded Tues-

day, Feb. 18 to Pioneer Natural
Gas area servicemenwho have
completeda course in basic
applied electricity.

The coursewas
by PioneerNatural Gas Co. of
Lubbock and the Regional
Occupational Center at Lub-

bock, a division of South Plains
College.

K4

Hippy MrtMiy
I f l 2

Mrs Jim Wells
Mrs Joe White
Larry Itamage
Neal Barnes
Homer Hobinctt
Rhonda Mosely
Wilma Williams
Dale Nichols

March I

Mrs 0 L Weakley
Victor Hudman
Michcat JamesMuthls
niillc Williams
Tommy Messcr
J W Payton
Larry Waldrip
Deborah Ann Horton
Elmer Estill
Amado Fucntcs Jr.
Dovlc Jolly

March 2

Mrs L. G. Thuett Sr.
Mrs JamesDietrich
Kay Hcrron
Ken Herron
Jimmy Wells
Maysel James
John Johnson
William Hudman
Robert Lee Haglcr
Tammyc McDonald
Mrs. Ronnie Graves
Ruth Pate
Annie Bell Fucntcs
Molly Conoly

March 3
Mrs. WayneCarpenter
Mrs. Jim Norman
Derrcll York
Mrs. Oscar Gordon
Mary Jon Webster

March J
Wyanza Windham Mock
Garry Don Haines
Mary Ellen McCullough
Sam II. Long
Alene Crawford

March S

Richard Fucntcs

. K t sssssVsS1 1 r

i
AND WOMAN OF YEAR

OF YEAR
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Always A

WUWNG
COIOS

FAMILY GROUPS
WELCOME

PLUS 60c
Film Charge

11 to 6

Thursday, 27
CHILDREN, TEENAGERS OR ADULTS

ONE fER SUBJECT TWO PER FAMILY
SATISFACTION GUARANTEED
FAMILY WELCOME

AT

Congratulations
to 1974

"Year" Award Winners

Post Chamber Banquet
for their many to

our

HrtKtsssssssssai

ssBslsH
MAN

Tom and Janey

Middleton

FARM FAMILY

row

Big Easter Special

Great

Gift

8x10
Portrait

99
a.m. p.m.

Feb.
BABIES,

GROUPS

PIGGLY WIGGLY

the

at

contributions

community

Mrs. Lois Williams
WOMAN OF YEAR

Frank Runkles
MAN OF YEAR

m 'W, ' 'LBLIsssH
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FARM FAMILY OF YEAR

NATIONAL BANK
Home Owned and Home Operated
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WANT AD H TKS
Flnl Insertion pf r Word Sc
Consecutive Insertions

Iter word tc
Minimum Ad. IS Words 73c
tlrirt Cord of Thanks 1.23

Real Estate

FOR SALE OR TRADE Four
room and bath house In Post
Sell for $3,750 00 or trade (or
unimproved land If interested
call ;pr write Gerald Bradley,
910 Curry Drive. Macum
Georgia.31201

4tc 7

SPACIOUS HOUSE FOR SALE
See"to appreciate. Move be-

causeof health. Large back
yard, cyclone fence, carpeted,
double carport. 109 South Ave
R. G. E. Bright. Call 495-32-

41 p 7

NEW 3 bedroom, l bathhome
In northwestPost, Centralheat,
evaporativeair; fully carpeted.
8 financing available. Fred
Myers, 7 Slaton Savings
& Loan

tfc 10-1-0

FOR SALE: Valdez Lounge,
houseand four lots. For more
information, phone 495-305-

9tc 0

Garage Sales

GARAGE SALE Thursday.
Friday and Saturday, weather
permitting. 601 West 6th. Billie
Windham

Itc 7

GARAGE SALE: Saturday. 113
North Ave. Q.

Hp 7

For Rent

APARTMENT FOR RENT:
Furnished, bills paid, for one
person or a couple. $100 per
month. Mrs. M B. Pevchousc.
108 West 6th. Post.

tfc 7

x FOR RENT: Furnished duplex
1 apartment. 116 N. Ave. S

Phone495-260-5.

tfc 7

Mud Chains
--All Sizes--

Garza
Auto Parts

Sale Ends
RebatesEnd

Legal Notice
NOTICE TO UIDOKItS

Notice is hereby given that
the Honorable Commissioners'
Court of Garza County will
receivebids for the purchaseof
one automobile for the Sheriff's
Departmentof GarzaCounty, to
Include:

One (1 solid color
automobile.350 to 440 cubic
inch engine, heavy-dut- y auto-
matic transmission, heavyduty
electrical system, heating and
air conditioning, heavy duty
shock absorbers,vinyl scats,
spot-ligh- t, radio, tinted glass.

One 1971 Plymouth.
Motor No. PK41N1D246792, Li-

cense No. 194815 Is available for
trade-i- n Bids are to be
submitted with and without
trade-i-n.

Bids will be received until
10 00 o'clock a m. Monday,
March 10, 1975. at which time
they will be opened and
considered. Bids arc to be
submittedto the County Judge's
Office, County Courthouse,
I'ost, Texas.

Giles W. Dalby
County Judge,GarzaCounty,

Texas.
2tc 7

NOTICE OF ELECTION
By action of the City Council,

City of Post on February 10,
1975, that an election be held In
saidCity of Poston April 5, 1975
for the purpose of electing a
Mayor and three Councilmcn;
the Mayor and two Councilmcn
being for two year terms and
one councilman for one year
term.

That said election shall be
held in the City Hall located 105
E. Main. Post, Texas, with
Faye Cockrell as Presiding
Judge. The polls at the above
designated polling place shall
on election day be open from
8:00 o'clock a. m. to 7:00
o'clock p. m.

The absentee voting for the
above designatedelection shall
be held at City Hall. 105 E.
Main, Post, Texas,beginningon
the 17th dayof March. 1975 and
ending on the 1st day of April,
1975. Said place oPabsentee
voting will remain open be-
tween the hours of 8 30 to 5:00
Monday through Friday.

AH members of the Council
were present and in favor of
calling City Election.

G C McCrary
Mayor

Attest:
Wanda Wllkcrson
City Secretary

2tc2-2-7

Wanted

INCOME TAX work for indivi-

dualsand businesseswanted by
Tech graduate HomerCawthon
495-250-7 after 5

4tc2--6

1
Sat. Night!
Fndav went!

HURRY! HURRY! HURRY!

"As Is" Specials
'65 PLYMOUTH R.

With transmission, console radio, new battery,
good tires, local one owner

$595
'U PONTIAC TEMPEST R.

White. AM stereo tape, radio, automatic, air conditioned,
almost new steel belted radial tires, very clean for the
model, locally owned.

$695
'5 PONTIAC TEMPEST 2?DR.

Vinyl roof over crimson red. automatic good1 tires, one
owner.

$595
'70 CHEVROLET R. 1EL AIR

350 engine, good tires, air power steering, AM radio
automatic, tutone paint, local

$795
'6? CHEVROLET IMPALA

SPORT SEDAN
Fair Hres. automatic air power steerwg. AM radio look
this we ever before yu but a cheap car

$695
'47 BUICK ELECTRA R. SEDAN

Power wifidowi pwer steerwg. radio, fair tires clean
iflteiw runs good cheap transportation only

$595

Hariii Lucas Mitirs
Dial 2425

The Post (Ten ) DHpakh Thursday, Fth. 27, 1975

For Sale
IIKUE NOW' Jay s Fix It Shop
on I'arrtsh Grocery Parking
Lot Dondcd locksmith Keys
made with or without pattern
All kinds of locks rcpalrrd
Small appliances repaired
Hound saw blades, scissors,
knives and garden tools sharp-
ened

tfc 0

FOH SALE: One I960 4020 John
Deere on LPG with new tires
and 1800 hrs. since overhaul.
Onesix row crust busier. Phone

tfc 0

COMING TO LUBBOCK? TV
need repair?Sameday service
on most sets in by noon. Bring
pickup and save 10 per cent on
salesor service Authorized
Zenith Warranty Center. Hay's
TV and Appliance. 2825 34th.
Lubbock. 793-556-

tfc

SIGN PAINTINGS: Also letter-In- g

and drawing for posters,
storeposters,etc. Work guaran-
teed. Phone

tfc 0

CUSTOM MADE BELTS AND
CHAPS, New and usedsaddles.
Saddles rebuilt. Boot and shoe
repair. Tack for the horseman.
Bob's SaddleRepairs 44 miles
Southwestof Post.

tfc 3

FOR SALE: Tandum
Disc, drag type with pickup
cylinder. Hayme plow.
Sec or call V. M. Stone. 119 S.
Ave S or call

tfc

FOR SALE: I, 500 gallon water
tank' on trailer; one 3 inch
Johnsonwater lubricated pump
set at 90 ft., one 1957 one ton
GMC truck. Phone 495-220- H.
A. Justice.

tfc 3

BOOTS, SHOES & SADDLE
Repairs, also new and used
saddles. Garza Feed and
Supply, 122 West Main.

tfc 8--

FOR SALE: Pedigree
white rabbits, mixed

breeds, breeding stock, fertili-
zer, bunnies. Phone 99C-36- or
996-225- Southland. Nathan
Dickerson.

tfc 12-1-2

FOR SALE: 14 x 64 two'
bedroom custom made mobile
home, seven miles on US B4

north, U mile south. Sec Bill
Richardson.

tfc 9

TO GIVE AWAY: Onelemale
cat. Call 3380 days or 3640
nights.

Itc 7

FOR SALE: 196S International
Scout, drive, 4 cyl top
shape.S650 cash.Call 36G6.

Itc 7

FOR SALE 1972 Dodge De-mo-

318 engine,power and air,
new tires. S. L. Butter. 495-221-

tfc 7

TREAT rugs right, they'll be a
delight If cleaned with Blue
Lustre. Rent electric shamp-ooe-r

$1. Hudman Furniture Co.

lie 7

EXCELLENT, efficient and
economical, that's Blue Luster
carpet and upholstery cleaner.
Rent electric shampoocr $1.
Wackcr's

Itc 227

Everyone reads personal
Items n The Dispatch, call us
your news at 2816.

Dicktns County

5 Pet

Card of Thanks
The Thomas Amnions family
would like to convey their
appreciation for the kindness
and thoughtfutnessof all their
friends who so generously
provided comfort and assist-
ance during our recent time of
sorrow We also would like to
thank nil of (he nursesat Garza
Memorial llosnltnl. nr w r
Wilson. Dr. Charles Tubbs and
Dr. Harry Tubbs.Wc will never
forget what they have done for
our loved one

The family of Mrs. Suda
Gurlcy wish to express our
thanks to you for your cards,
visits, flowers, gifts, and
prayers. To the friends who
brought food and the ladies that
served It. To the Twin Cedar
Nursing Home Starf for your
patience, kindness and loving
care, will remain with us
always. Wc deeply appreciate
the Revs. Glenn necce, Gene
Prcvo. and Leon Smith for their
comforting words and the
beautiful music and singing
that madetheservice complete

A special thanks to Dr.
Charles Tubbs for his service
andkindnessduring the lengthy
illness anddeath of our mother.
Wc also welcomed the visits
and prayers of other ministers
who visited us. To the
pallbearers and honorary pall-
bearers,wc will always rcmcm
bcr you for this kind deed. God
bless each of you.

Mrs. Ruby Carpenter
and family

Mr. and Mrs. A. P. Gurlcy
and family

Mr. and Mrs. JessGurlcy
and family

Mr. and Mrs. Denver Gurlcy
and family

Thank you very much to our
family, relatives and friends for
the beautiful flowers, cards,
letters and phone calls 1

receivedsincemy accidentand
surgery in Navarro County
Memorial Hospital at Corsl-can- a,

also since I've been
home. I am now out of the cast
and trying to walk. It meansso
much to haveyour thoughtsand
prayers. J. D Joins me in
wishing the very best to each
and everyone in our hometown
and area

Lucille Windham
Oakwood, Texas

We wish to express our
deepestappreciation to all the
people who cared and loved
Edith Lewis and the many
services rendered for us in
memory of her.
The Family of Mrs. S. M. Lewis

I wish to express thanks to
friends, in the Post Chamberof
Commercefor selecting me as
"Man of the Year." I feel very
humble and unworthy of such
an honor I certainly do
appreciate It. My congratula-
tions go to all the dedicated
members who worked so hard
to have a very good annual
banquetunder adverseweather
conditions

Chief Runkles

The family of Mrs. Tom R
Carter wishes to expressthanks
for the many expressionsof
sympathy shown at the recent
passing of our mother In
particular, deepappreciation is
felt for the kindness and
attention given during her
illness by William Wilson, m d
Ruby Shedd LVN. Rev. Oscar
Newdigger. Mrs. Anlha Huff
man and Mrs. Eunice Porter
and Miss Micha Cross

.n.lsPa,ch classifieds work
wh,lc you slct'P

Young Farmers

Farm Equipment

Auction Sale
SATURDAY, MARCH 29, 1975

To Consign Equipment contact:
M. D. McGALLIARD

Phone 806-271-457- 4, Spur
Consignments to be Included In this
sale should be in by March 15 to be
Included in advertising.

JamesCruce and Jack Duk'n
OF PLAINVIEW
AUCTIONEERS

Commission: 10 Pet. on $100 or less
over $100

f
Farm Loans

Farm & Ranch
Loans

Some oi the many
advantages of a Land

Bank Loan.

I Long Term

Flexible Repayment

Terms

Lowest Possible
Interest Cost

I Minimum Closing Cost

No Repayment Penally

Fast Efficient Service

SeeJay Dee House,
Manager, in the

Post Insurance Bldg
Wednesdaysor at

1647 Ave. J, Tahoka
Phone998-414- 0

Subcribe to The Dispatch,
only $5.25 a year, savesyou 52
trips to the store

Post Lodge No. 1058
A. F. & A. AA.

Reg. Meeting on 2nd Thurs.
BILL MILLS .. ....W.M.
i'AUL JONES Sect.

CHUCK

U.S. Good Beef
POUND

DECKER'S

Picnics
Smoked

lb 590

MlOtVt

G0U

W FREE

UKflUt A MEDIUM, DOZEN

EGGS
6 0Z. PKGS.

N-e-

Keiths 10 Ot Pits

Brocolli

dividends dtre
vets on insurance

WACO - Government Life
hwiinincc dividends totaling a
record S.tJS.noo.OOO will be paid
during 197S lo veterans who
have kept their World 'nr f.

World War II and Korean
Conflict insurancepolicies in
force Director of Waco VA
Regional office. Jack Cokcr.
pointed out that this Is the first
time dividends will be paid on
Korean Conflict insurance poli-

cies
Tills year total Is $3l,ROO,000

more than the nmount paid In
1974 The dividend Is payable
only on participating policies
which are currently In force
Thcscnre Identified hy the

Card Of Thanks

Pleaseaccept this Thank You
as a personal messagefor your
prayers, cards, letters, visits,
calls and flowers, I received
during my illness.

Nona Smith

Help Wanted
HELP WANTED: Oil field
workers wanted, Rocker A Well
Service 495-346-

tfc 3

WANTED LVN for relief
nurse Twin Cedar Nursing
Home Pleaseapply in person

tfc 0

ED'S

DIAL
495-250- 2

ALL WORK
GUARANTEED

Carpentry
Built Up Roof

ROAST

780
FIRST CUT

CHOPS

lb 890

We Redeem
Gold Bond Stamps
on or any

in the store!

GOLD BOND means

TRITKAKE.

Now

item

fCmu
GIFTS FOR YOU. . .

Pancake & Waffle
Mix 3 for $1.00

FUftWA, 13'A 0Z. CANS

Tuna Cat Food...3 for $1.00

Arrival! Onion Limited
supply

FROZEN SPECIALS"'",, Hd.m
DONALD DUCK 6 0Z CANS

Orange 4$1.00

Spears

3$1.00

Record

ROOFING

PORK

MMMMMMMIMAMMMMIMMMIMWMIMMMM

groceries

69c

Plants

Juice
Keith's. 10 0 Pigs

Cauliflower

351.W

letters "K" In front of USOLt
World War I) policy numlwr

the letter "V In front of NSl.j
World War II) number and

the loiters "RS" or "W" In
front of VSLI iKorean Conflict!
policy numbers

Cokcr reported that the NSLI
dividend amount would be
M07.500.000. This dividend will
be paid to 3.720.000 world War
II policyholders. An average of
W3 per Insured will be paid on
the anniversary date of each
policy tn 1974. the average
dividend was approximately
S75

The USOLI dividend of
$22,000,000 will be paid to
130.000 World War I policyhold-
ers The average Individual
dividend Is $1C9 as compared to
$136 In 1974

A dividend of $0,100,000 will
bo paid to 560,000 VSLI (Korean
Conflict policyholders. An
average dividend of $11 will be
paid to each insured, their first
dividend under this program.

O.N HONOR HOI.I.
Cindy Bird, daughter of Mr.

and Mrs. Jimmy Bird was
listed on the dean's honor roll
at Howard County Junior
College at Big Spring this last
semester.Studentsmust obtain
a 3.5 average to be listed on the
Dean's list.

Norma and Beth want your
news,call 2810,

CARPET

CLEANING
ProfessionalCleaning at
Prices You Can Afford

Phone 495-261- 5

Or Call Collect

806-799-27- 55

Carpet Cleaning Discount

Russet, 10 Bac

BUNCHES

gam

Refunds
by Sin

h
tta can

""nR now m

Jerry sZ'Wd

..nps explain
Austin c J
. -- .ciurnj ,(,..orrlvi. mii.

maBncl.cally code?

" in me
the return

People one n...
.SET-
FollisHeaH

& Air Cor

Sales insUM

Service

PAYNE
EQUIPMEr

ARK-L- SEW

BRYANT GAS I

Gas Units Can!

Financed With

Approved Credit

FREE ESTIMATE!

DIAL 628-32- 1

WILSON,

Fresh Barbecui
COOKED DAILY!

CHICKEN, BEEF, PORK, SAUSAGI
CaH for Special Meat Cuts on Special Orders

Lb.

FRESH

"fund,

Scrvlc

28 Oz. Bottles ;

No Deposit

Pascal Celery, Stalk

Potatoes

690

COG
COL

3-1- .0

Texas JuT

Orang

5 Lb.

Bag

PEAI

Green Onions 21

ThesePikes Cm4 thru Saturday, March I

rAKKIMI
121 W Main MLIIrUT

peril?

me

actual
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CER'S
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Report made

on counstini
LEVELUNb - In the flrtt

quarterly report lo the Texas
Commission on Alcohollim, the

South Plains Alcoholism Coun-cdln- g

Services Proecl served
i!7 clients, acconWn to Joe
Meadow, coordinator-counselo- r

of he area project
The nrst quarterly report was
(or tho months of October,
November and December.

Besides counseling tho alco-

hol abusersand the families as
well as alcoholics, counselors
have Initiated three Mexican

American Alcoholism study
Sessions and one Black Alco-

holism Study Session. The
counselorsalso have initiated

county mi Unn
probates in
Counties.

Gana ana trosby nc This group trom Hrownficid, nil
Goal for South Plains

Counseling Services
Project Is to reach 300 alcohol

abusers and and
their families In Bailey, Coch-

ran, Crosby, Dickens, Floyd,
Garza. Hale, Hockley, King
Lamb, Lynn, Motley, Terry
and Yoakum counties.

IVITATION EXTENDED

. .... w fathrart and Mr. and Mrs.

lp. ..' .l. (nHc nf Mr. lrw (I uevi Callis
me N't"" " ' "

I at 305 West 14th St. anytime
EWsWYIrc

k;.ll,fau
or Sunday. March 2nd to help her

uiiuiu";

LAVELLE SHOP

Has Closed!

to thank you
patronageover these

130 years.

Watch for our successor
en in the same location.

Accounts owing to
lie Shop may be paid to

il McMahon, Ph. 495--

1,115 N. Ave. 0.

Again, thank you!

fcrHi Lavelle Bennett
frr V. McMahon, Manager

kmh
828-629- 1

REBATE
TRADE-IN-S

M

it '

Pi

-- rri i ii m i i g i mu rnrm'mi'i ii i

lull f H

DWI lor
JURDANS gospl-5lngln- g Tex., gUMU

Alco-

holism

alcoholics

Owner

vg, PS, Air

PI,

Air

Bin ion

jurry aim oruce joraan ana meir wives, rvwiiy ana loueen, piciurea oDove, 1.4.present their gospel songsat p. m. Sunday, March 2, at tho Grassland gUcST nigill
01 me wazarene,12 miles west and two soutn ot post, tveryone is

Invited to theseyoung people who travel Canadato California In a
motor home outreach for Christ In gospel

: in

now in
COLLEGE STATION - Cur-

rent pork supplies ore "high
quality" and nt relatively low
cost, Mrs. Gwcndolync Clyatt
reported this week.

"Good valuesshouldbe found
on pork loins roasts and
chops,center and end-cu-t chops
and somesmokedpicnics," the
consumer marketing Informa-
tion specialist with the Texas
Agricultural Extension Service

At counters, this year's
larger supplies arc due to
greateramountsof lower-grad-e

beef, theTexasA&M University
System specialist said.

"Good beef values include
chuck cuts, ground beef,
and rib roasts and a variety of
steaks.Soup meat and liver are
other features.

fo
LELKHART, IND-I- 974 will

be rememberedns the year of
many things-Waterg- ate, pres-
idential resignation and suc-
cession, inflation, recession,7

cent unemployment and,
1974 will be rememberedas the
year that Americans became
fully aware of the world hunger
crisis.

This increased awareness,
and a desire to do somethingto
correct the problem, was
reflected in their giving to

the Community Hunger
Appeal of Church World Ser-

vice.
In 1974, people all across

America gave $4,029,558 to the
CROP HungerAppeal. This was
an increaseof 25 per cent over
1973. An additional $312,418 was
given to purchase blankets for
the Church World Service
Clothing Appeal, administered
by CROP.

1974 witnessedmany changes
in the world hunger situation.

H Grand Torino

PB,Autematic,

I'd'HTnTrrrrrmrrnnrfB

L3

tr&wRL'mRF

Marilyn Cotton
classes

miles
hear

with their song.

Pork supplieshigh
qualify,

added.

Americans

CRO-P-

"Some markets also have
featureson fryer chickensand
turkeys and eggs arc a
bargain at present prices,"
Mrs. Clyatt noted.

In frozen food sections,
Lenten season promotions arc
centering on fish consumers
should consider cod, haddock,
and oceanperch, the specialist
advised.

Economical fruits and vege-
tables include grapefruit,
oranges,apples,bananas,pears
and pineapples.

Also, cabbage, carrots, dry
yellow onions, hard shell
squash,turnips, rutabagas and
potatoes.

CONSUMER WATCH-
WORDS: D'Anjou, the principal
pearof the winter pear crop, Is
in unusually heavy supply.

CROP during 1974

FORD,

309500

IllMercury 1QQ500

Country Sedan 900KOO
PAutom.ticAir..,,s

Autamatic,

,HT'Vl,FS, Ayltwatic,

sfVWPsisisiPiirosiBsifHsiSss

cost

57QRM

1995M

1495

gave more

The Sahcl of West Africa,
for

finally
fall, in

been
focusing on aid,
shifted to

CROP funds are
now being used to build new
way of life for thousands of

become to Myrlie

situation con--

tinucd to worsen. Indian
India and

faces Its worst
since the great famine of
Bengal in 1943. There arc still
serious food In some
areasof the and in many

across Africa, Asia and
Latin America.

Leukemia funds
now needed

SAN The South
Central Texas Chapter of the
LeukemiaSociety ofAmerica Is
calling on all business firms
with leukemia coinboardson
their counters to convert the

check or
money order and mail to Its

at 10C San
Antonio

Citizens also arc asked to
advisebusinessmen when they
see such on their
counters.

The instruction for
the of the coinboards
"has goneawry" and thefunds
arc needed to the
agency'sleukemia operations.

Bruc

Graham HD in

plans for
The Graham Home Demon

stratlon club met Friday in the
center. Roll call was answered
with "A Change You Would
Like to Sec in the County Fair. '

Most members wish it could
be held in the fall. A discussion
held for the program included
plans for the fair to be held
next week.

Mrs. Nona Lusk, hostess,
served refreshments to seven
members. club will not
meet March and the next
meeting be March 21.

Merrymakersclub
meet hereTuesday

The Merrymakers club met
Tuesdayat the home of Maudie
Hanklns. The evening was spent
visiting.

were served to
Ihe following members, Nora
Kiker. Bonnie Adamson, Pearl

Bonnie Opal
Sadie Storic. Pearl

Linda Malouf and Bertha
Print One guest was present.
Winnie Henderson.

The next meeting will be
Tuesday.March 11. in Ihe home
of Nora Kikcr

drought-ridde-d six
received adequate rain-- ,

crop-cw- s programs Graham 1 hursday
this area, which had club meetsat Center

emergency
long-rang- e develop-

ment projects.
a

7

The Graham club
met last with Viva
Davis. The afternoonwas spent
visiting. A get well card was

helping them '8ncd and sent Mrs.

settled farmers. "vcr in nainvicw
the Refreshmentswere served by

The
Bang-

ladesh, famine

shortages

nations

ANTONIO

contributions

office Broadway,

so

coinboards

chapter's
return

continue

fair

will

Refreshments

McMahon,
Williams.

Thursday
Thursday

nomads,

Elsewhere,
Viva Davis, hostess, lo Mmes
Loucille Morris, Iris McMahon

Wallace and Ada Odcn
The club will not meet March

6 and the next meeting will be
March 20

YOUR CREDIT IS
GOOD MONTHLY
OR ANNUALLY

INSURANCE
495-305- 3051

204 E. Mam, Post, Tex.

j 202 E. Main

waiting. Gtv
. . . .

Us.

Recipes are
exchanged
Mrs Pearl Polk was hostess

to the Mystic Sewing Club when
It met In her home Friday. Feb
21

t tec!pen were exchanged by
the members present

A get well card was signedby
members and sent toMrs Nell
Windham who is ill.

Itefrcshmcnts were served to
members Mmes. Alyene
Itunkles. Mac Shipley, Winnie
Henderson, Maudic Hanklns.
Opal Williams, Jimmie Hud-man- ,

Henrietta Nichols and the
hostess

The next meeting will be
March 7 at 3 p. m. with Alyene
Itunkles ns hostess

two At M
i cali i iru IIQO

v

,

Air

will 5:45

from

beef

rump

per -

Sahcl

into

The

Storic,

Crisp.

years,

Pearl

The Post Art Guild held a
"Guest Night" at the regular
meeting Monday night In the
Women'sClub House

The program was presented
by Mrs. Zoe Kirkpatrick on
"Turquoise."

Mrs. Inez Hartel, hostess,
served refreshmentsto

Members Mmes Ada Lou
Bird, Lll Conner. Maxlne
Marks, Geraldine Butler, Eve-

lyn Neff, Betty Borcn, Lois
Williams. Ann Bishop, Marie
Neff. Boo Olson, Polly Cravy.
Mincoln Stewart, Jo Ann Reed
and honorary member, Ruby
Kirkpatrick.

Guests for the evening were
C. II. Hartel. A. J. and Judy
McAlistcr, Syd and Rusty
Conner. Margaret Bull. Mr and
Mrs. Frank Itunkles, Mr and
Mrs. Victor Hudman, John
Borcn. Janlc Middlcton. Dr
and Mrs B E. Young and Mrs.
Shelley Camp.

HD club meets
with Mrs. Davis

The Barnum Springs Home
Demonstrationclub met in the
home of Mrs. Delia Davis,
Thursday. Feb 13.

Roll call was answeredwith
What I Like or Dislike About

Teenagers."
raula Cawthon presented a

study about attitudes and
human potentials.

The Valentine theme was
carried out in the refreshments
which were" served to the
following members: Shirley
Bland. KIWanda Bradbury.
Mae McMahon and the guest
Paula Cawthon and hostess.
Delia Davis

liiiiinimn
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WORLD

mum
IS BACK!

m FtraulttlH

OVER 40.000,000

Available at
KOIt COl.l.IKH DltlT.
I MtltlSII OROCKRY

Now Available!

Complete Stock of

BUTTERICK PATTERNS

THE FABRIC MART

A ding-a-lin-g

ordersGas
air conditioning

Cm taVtg m ftk coflAttontag pcUHt to
your tor a ffM wrvvy d cott ttUmx l no
oUi (ton to you. IU'M wf N your qutnlont, nd
tH youwhat K uH 11 to totteH GAS lr conditioning
In your torn, k't (K Hrl my Hep towardhaving
your dapudaMt GAS ftk con4M toning lntalkd Wort
tfea lift! K(, windy 4y her

AGASftk cowrfUlorurm ytm It ruMfuNy bulk lo cool
quUtly nd kWf4ty. TKtt arc lrwr movtrtf pan.and
no comarxtof to lw V down ot wr out. IUt from it
auadyMm Hmm tkcuWtta t riflrnt through tht
yitm to coo) i4m k. h't tMt tlmpU princlpW that (v

GAS akconatWonlrujUi long bt llhno tot ol cooling
capacityand aymatnKnanc.

Irttlall GAS air conAtlonlng now. You'll avokl ih nah,
andb enjoying th u4l.cooling comfort ol ' ?

GAS air conHlonlng wMU everyone
ctM I u

ring

C4i

FAMOUS

BOTTLESSOLD

Dial 3665

The Post (Tex.) Dispatch Thursday,Feb. 27, 1975 fm 5
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INVITATION EXTENDED

Friends of Mr. and Mrs. Tom
Bouchler extend an Invitation for a
reception In their honor Sunday
afternoon, March 2, from 3 to 5 p.m.
In the bank's Community Room.

CORNER GROCERY O
M

A

R

K

E

T

ChocolateMilk 390
aViwMaMwMVAAAaa4aV

10 0z. Bottles

6 Bottle Carton

Plus Deposit . . ,

Borden's,Qfirt

Bwden's, Hah Gaton

Mellorine 790

10 Pewl All Purpose

Potatoes 79C

Coke-Orange-Spri-
te

WE GIVE AND REDEEM

Gold Bond Stamps

0O

IJUUUUUUUUUki

HOT BAR-B-QU- E

Cooked Fresh Daily

Hot Links-Bee- f

Pork Ribs-Chicke- ns

German Rings

aBBBBBaK

790

"7

.. .:

Right now at
Raferti you'll find

a greatselection of

Lady Wrangler

Jeans

Including 3" waistband
super bells and
stretchJeans.

Also shirts,
blouses,tank
tops, ts,

hoodedT-shi- rts

and halter

WE GIVE S&H GREEN STAMPS!

CHARGE ACCOUNTS AND LAYAWAYS WELCOMEI

7

g
o

J



GRAHAM COMMUNITY NEWS

Glenn Huntley brings son from Guam for schooling
'l MRS. R1.KNN DAVIS afternoon with her mother. and Mrs Viva Davis MmtJ Map nnttoll tt-- iBy

RfSK Glenn Huntley and son Cam
In last Friday and visited

nvwith his parents. Mr and Mrs.
i Sexton Huntley In Post and Mr.

! and Mrs. E. E Peel, his wife's
parents. Cam will remain here
and finish this term of school.

. nGIcnn is stationed In Guam.
' -- .Mrs. Huntley and two sons
. remained atJiomc
lr r Mr. and Mrs Ben Benton of

Irving spent the weekendhere
iitMwIth relatives. The Benton's
fcrttarid Mrs. Innls Thuctt were

.Saturday luncheon guestsof
Mr. and Mrs. WagonerJohnson
and Jerry

Mr. and Mrs. Ambers Parrlsh
attended funeral services In
Nocona last Friday for a long
time friend Bill Wade.

mi Sundayvisitors of the Bobby
( Cowdrey family were Mr. and

""Mrs. Homer Jones, the Noel
White family and the Ronnie
Graves family

Mrs- Wade Terry and Mrs.
, Viva Davis visited Mrs. J M.

Bush last Tuesdayafternoon.
Rusty Gravesand Miss Becky

..Mahaffey of Lubbock visited
..'iiSunday afternoon with his

grandmother. Mrs Mary Eth
ridge.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray McClellan
wand Mr. and Mrs Bill
nMcMahon visited Thursday

evening with Mr and Mrs. Carl
Fluitt.

,t Mrs. Joe Fondy and baby
"'daughterof Lubbock spent last

Thursday night with her par-
ents, Mr and Mrs. Joe Taylor

: ond sister, Helen Fern
o. Mrs JasonJustice visited
o Inst Thursdaywith her parents,

Mr. and Mrs Fred Gossett
ii ReV. and Mrs. Douglas Gossett

f Claud visited his parents the
Gossettson Friday and Satur-
day and visited tn Post Sunday

"More crippled

. children now
it, Becauseof the steady growth
,, hi numbersof crippled children

ond adults In Texas, the Easter
M.Scal Society for Crippled
,jChildren and Adults of Texas

,, hassteppedup its rehabilitation
;o services.
i!w Mrs. Martha Compton,who is
r, the EasterSeal Representative
.,'for the County, said 20,152

handicapped Texans received
Easter Seal treatments during

"Despite medical scientific
advances,'' Mrs. Compton ex-

plained, "the ran,K of .the
crippled art growing: This Is

because of populi(i6n growth,
increased numberof accidents

yfind medical treatment which
' saves victims of crippling
''diseases who might not have
'rtved tn past years "

Quoting the annual report of
'the Easter Seal Society for

'""Crippled Children and Adults of
'Texas, affiliated treatment
"centers in Texas provide
treatmentand rehabilitation,

speech and hearing and educ-
ational programs, and many

olher services required by the
''physically disabled to live

normal lives
The largest group served

''includes those with major
deformities of bonesand joints,

" 'Severespeechdefects, cerebral
T palsy, arthritis, muscular dys-''trop-

and multiple sclerosis
Tind stroke The Easter Seal

Campaign, which provides
'funds for continuation of these
'services, begins February 24,

'"and continues through March
'30. EasterSunday.

f Among new non-flatto- books
tinow on library shelves are

"Behold Men" by Lennart
JWIIsson. "The CIA and the Cult
5 of Intelligence" by victor
3 Marchettl and'TexasHomes of
g the 19th Century" by Drury

Alexander
i New fiction offerings Include

"The Three Persons Hunt" bjr

Brian Garfield. "Dead Solid
Perfect" by Dan Jenkins, and
"Fear of Flying" by Erica
Jong

New arrivals in junior fiction
include Tarrie s War by Nina
Bawden. Red Rock over the
River by Patricia Realty and
"A Month of Sundays" by Rose
Blue There's also a new easy
book Father Christmas" by
Raymond Urlggs

iiiiYr

S4fPTS

Ht fut er of truck
food (owot upotura
lu tnsn hand letterInc
wily tmnsfert from on

vhiclt ta another

DON AMMONS

- NCT

Mrs R L Cumrnings and
returned home Monday Elmer

Mrs. Belle Braummcr passed Mmcs
away last week in Uucna Park.
Calif She was a sister of Mrs Mr
Ada Oden We extend sympathy were
to Mrs Oden Wednesday
visitors of Mrs Oden were Mrs
Era Atcn. Mrs Reba Turner Tahoka

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE
Insurance

M LIABILITY
CROSS-BLU- E SHIELD

Robert Harvick,
AGENT ROB

Phones 998-432- 0 &

TAHOKA,

Bra nm fmr Mrfcf Hlw
ta an tim TF m As mI tmw

l i l I I i V.

BRRRRRRRRRRK B

V

Last week visitors In the
Cowdrey homo were
Jewell Parrlsh, Jo

Williams, and Pearl Wallace
and Mrs Dclmcr Cowdrey

luncheonguests.
Mrs Carl Fluitt visited her

mother, Mrs L W Gandy in
last Thursday

For All Your Needs

BLUE

998-459- 1

man
I

PLAY

GET

StH

IUNIOR

RRRHEl

EBMF

Sunday

Mrs

Agency Mgr.
GOLDEN

Res. Phone998-477- 9

TEXAS

11

I L

oirtr"lACK-OUr- "

lOOO EXTRA

GREEN STAMPS I

Um, m ninlil yn1..
ita4l mIwwi

VOLUME
FIVE

WITH 2'AS5
PURCHASE I .

AAi

tRITANNICA

JNOCLCffiffiDIA

McMahon. Rene Fluitt visited
Mrs Lonnle Peel last

RUSSETALL PURPOSE

Fage 6

Jo Williams aunt. Mrs. Friday

POST ANTENNA

At

BIB

The Post (Tex.) Dispatch

Kaiher Wnl pelicnt
OorM Memorial Hospital. Her
brother ami wifo. Mr. and Mrs.

Morion Puree!'. Okln
are here

We wish for all those who arc
ill fast recovery

We had some blizzard last
night and Saturday!

429 EAST MAIN

CO., INC.

Hours: 9 to 12, to 5 Mondays
through Fridays

Office Phono 3127
After hours Call 3603

Jimmy Evans, Manager
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BINGO
Every Sunday

3 to 6 PM

PUBLIC IS INVITED - -
Lots of Prizes

No Alcoholic Beverages

VFW

FEATURING UNITED'S PROTIN BEEF"

ROAST SH0UL5 WASIE i
ROAST

$(

.ElEBmU

A

BLADE

CHILI pla,n gebhardt'.?. icAN 59f
mm . mmm GEBHARDT'S

PORK
9sddszC....

BIAH

HALL

F.R!.ELBr
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STEAK !..E
STEAK LB..$
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SPRITE OR

t

32oz. BOTTLES

6CARTON
BOTTLE
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AM 9?tfon farmers
It. Accnnllnu

wfh loss may gef fax help

Income iax
Service

Tax Returns
nrtice In My Home
iretefltly comptettd tax ceurseto

learn all details of

w tax laws.

CALL 495-262-7

FM DWECTKNS TO MY HOMC

W-- W INCOME TAX

and BookkeepingService
WANDA DOOLEY

MORTON ECONOMY

causethe bottom droppedout of
necattle andcotton markets in

1974. farmers and ranchers
suffered a "net operating loss-m-

ay

be able to get some
Income tax relief on Income
previouslyearned.

FOOD KING CRINKLE CUT

Wavnn
flaycnga. economist for the
Texas Agricultural Extension
Service, the Internal Hcvcnue
Service has special provisions
tiiat deal with "net operating
losses."

"The loss h.usl first

back three years and
applied agaL.st the taxable
Income that year," points

"!f the taxable income
that year was not sufficient
offset the operating loss, the
remaining loss applied
against the Income

NEW OFFICE HOURS (Beginning March, 1975)

I will be In the office as usual Monday through
Saturday, and the afternoons except Friday and
Saturday, with the exceptions of absencesfor
continuing education, vacationsand holidays.

Appointments should be made whenever possible.
Circumstancesbeyond my control make

inadvisable for me to promise to deliver babies after
February 28, 1975, except the caseof bona fide
emergency.
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"FROZEN FOODS

DINNERS
MAC. & CHEESE
MAC. & BEEF
SPAQ. & MEAT BALLS
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second preceding year, and
then to the Immediate past
year

"If there Is still a remaining
loss over the total taxable
income of the prior years, the
loss is carried forward to each
of the next five yearsuntil all is
used to offset Income "

When a net operating loss
occurs,a claim for refund must
be filed to recover taxespaid In
prior years, points out Haycn-g-a

This claim is also accessary
to establish the amount of loss.
If any. to be carried forward to
offset future Income Some

of taxable income
of prior years may be required

Due to some of the unusual
features of the "net operating
loss" provisions, llayenga sug-
gests the assistance of a
qualified tax consultant or an

SCHILLING PURE
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"Why Is It that when ! !H
a good story I have to Htton
to a poor one?"

IKS agent
A claim regarding net operat-

ing losses can be filed at any
lime within three years after
the return was duefor the year
the loss occurred

The deadline for filing farm
and ranch income tax returns
in Mar 3 unless an estimated
return was filed In that case
the deadline for the final return
Is April 15.

DR. FRANK BUTTERFIELD
Optometrist

OFFICE Mondays 1:30 to 5:30 P. M.
HOURS: Thursdays 1:30 to 5:30 P. M.

206 West Main Ph. 495-368- 7
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Oil, (la and Mineral Leases
E M. Woodard, surviving

husbandof llattic Woodard, to
Griffin and Burnett. Inc. a tract
nut of Section25. Block 6 -- - G8

acre tract of SW portion.
Mrs Jewell Heed a widow;

Fcrnle Reed and Weldon Reed
to Griffin and Burnett, Inc.
68 acresout of SW portion of
Section 25. Block 6.

Mrs. Eugenia Bright and
Haskell L. Odom to Griffin and
Burnett. Inc a tract out of Sec.
25. Block 6 a 68 acre tract out-b- f

SW portion.
Mrs. Lillic Cantrell to Griffjn

and Burnett. Inc a C8 acre
tract out of Section 25, Blockl'e,
SW portion

Dora Faye Walker, ndc
Dclavan to Traverse Corp.'the
NW'i and South 60 acres of'SW
' ( of Section4 of the H&GN ll
Survey Co.

Kenneth Montgomery 'to
Southland Royalty Co. all !of
Sec. 52 in Block 2. ' :

Theodocia Agnes King, ''a
widow, to Griffin and Burrlcfl,
Inc a 500 acre tract out of 'the
West Part of Survey 1301 BS&F
Survey :

Mary Wood Foster and
husbandto Griffin and Burnct,
Inc a 500 acre tract outof west
part of Survey 1301. BS&F
Survey

Virgil W Wood and wife io
Griffin and Burnett, Inc. a 500
acre tract out of west part 6f
Survey 1301, BS&F Survey. .

Homa Wood and wife (o
Griffin and Burnett, Inc., a 500
acre tract out of west part of
Survey 1301 BS&F Survey. ':

Ethel G Wood, a widow (o
Griffin and Burnett, Inc., a SQ0

acre tract out of west part pf
Survey 1301. BS&F Survey. ;

Lcla Howard Wood, a widow,
to Griffin and Burnett, Inc., 'a
500 acre tract out of west part
of Survey 1301, BS&F Survey.:

Ralph N Miller and wifd;
Riley C. Miller and wife to
Griffin and Burnett Inc., all Of

Sections36. Abstract92C and ajl
of Section37, Abstract 15C all in
Block 6 of H&GN RR Survey.:

Ralph N. Miller. Riley Clyde
Miller, James Richard Miller
and Elizabeth Miller Smith' to
Griffin and Burnett, Inc., all of
Section 36, Abstract 92G and all
of Section37. Abstract 157 all In
Block 6 and H&GN RR Co.
Survey.

Marriage License
Noble Paul Simpson and

Evca Witt

Mother buried
here Wednesday

Burial servicesfor Mrs. A. D.
(Josephine)Hord were heldat 2

p. m. Wednesday, Feb. 26 in
TerraceCemeterywith Memo-
rial Servicesat 2 30 in the First
Baptist Church with the Rev.
Glenn Recce, pastor, officiat-
ing. Hudmans Funeral Home
was in charge of the services.

Mrs. Hord was born Feb. .17,
1913 in Ballinger and died at the
age of 62 in a Stcphenville
hospital. She had been a
resident of Stcphenville for four
years.Shewas married to A. D.
Hord in Altus, Okla.

She Is survived by her
husband,a stepmother,Mrs.
Jack Whltaker. of Truscott,
Tex., one son, Joe Hord,
Gatesville, and one daughter,
Mrs. Kent Carlisle of Post;
three brothers,OscarWhitaker,
Tahoka, Gene Whitaker of
Pampa and Bob Whitaker of
Chillicothe and four grandchild'
rcn

The teacher askedher class,
"Who knows where dew comes
from" A pupil answered,"The
earth rotates to fast that 'it
begins to sweat'"

Gene's

Coffee

Shop
567 S. BrMdway

FEATURING

Chicken Fried
Steaks

Steaks

Mexican Food
ALSO

Full Breaidil and
Plait Lunch Menu

OPEN DAYS ;

WEEKLY '

6 AM TO 10 PM .

NOW CLOSING I
OK MONDAYS



Cold-shooti-ng

Dots pull away in last

half of bi-distr-
ict game

TheVt Antelopes offense
atne apart in the third period

.)( the gamewith the
.oahorhaBulldogs at Snyder
hicsitoy night and the district
IAA champs raced to an easy
18 to 48 victory

The Post shootershad a hard
Ime getting anything through
he hoop, hitting only 21 per
cnt from the field and canning

jut 20 out of 42 free throws
' In fact. Edward Price,
coming in as asubstitute in the
hird period, and Tony Conner
lit the only two basketsof the
ntlre game for the Lopes

lutsldeof a six-fo- rangeof the
loops

There was nothing really
wrong with cither Postrebound-,n-g

or defense.
; The Lopes beat Coahoma on
he boards47 to 31 and heldthe
Julldogs. who have been
iveraglng about 80 points per
game, to a measly 24 points in
he first half

The game was close through-m-t

the first two periods with
he Antelopes holding short
cads all through the first 24

nlnutcs of play
Coahoma led 9 to 8 at the end

f the first quarter and 24 to 22

it the halftime intermission.
Then came the third period

ind with the Lope attack unable
o get much of anything in the
wskct. the Bulldogs outshotthe
ocnls 21 to 9 and zoomed into a
ommandlng45 to 31 lead
The Lopes were neverable to

lose the gap under 10 points
ifter that andsubstitutes from
oth. clubs played the final

mnutcs of the game
The quickness of the Bull-log-

who threw a pressing
:ono over the entire floor,
roused 30 turnovers without a
ihot for the Lopes.

All in all it was the Lopes'
xxirest shooting of the season
ind the most turnovers

Bryan Davis led the Post
i Utack with 18 points before

oullng out and Conner was the
inly other Lope in double

t

ii igures with 11.

' Other Post scoring was Mike
A'aldrip six. Mike Shepherd
We. Price four, Kent Klrkpat-ic- k

three, andJerry Johnson
me

Kelso. Coahoma'sjumping
.ack'center who liked to dunk
he ball in practice, led the
3ulldogs with 19 and Mllliken
lad 17 The Bulldogs balance
ind depth is shown in the fact
hat all nine Coahoma players
jsed in the gamescoredfour or
nrc points

Coach John Alexander saidhe
vos pleased with the team's
lefenseand rebounding,but the
enm's inability to hit Iholr
mlsidc shotscost the Lopes any
hartce of staying with the
lardrunningBulldogs

llu sau! he thought It was due
o the lack of playoff experience
iy the locals Coahoma on the
ithor hand had gone Is the
egionals last year

It wos a rough game with 60
ouH being called. II whistled
igamst the Bulldogs and 39
ignmst the Antelopes Coahoma
nnrto better useof their charity
ippJirtunilles. canning 26 of 39

o ooly 20 of 42 for the locals

tJIVKN PIN
Lorenc Gttrdon. Mm

Knrtiia Mm lor. Mrs Alone
Brewer. Mrs Ann Grey and
Mr Delia Davis vttiled Mrs

PeeJ Tuesday. Peb 2

IKIva presentedher with her 20
retirement pin. they hud

orderedfor her after retirement
Jlrort) the lunchroom Cake, pie

and.coffee were enioved by all

Advertising pavs tr
Dispatch clasiified ad

! Th secretary's
( Best Friend!

t The mkKle way to

I quickly correct
your typmg errors.

S Only $1.25

Three Lopes Klrkpatrick.
Davis and Wnldrip - fouled out
of the game as did Kelso and
Jenningsfor Coahoma

Coach Alexander told The
Dispatch he wants to thank the
Post fans again, on behalf of
the team, for their fine support
all seasonjnd at the
game in Ihe Scurry County
Coliseum. t

As usual", he said, "we had
more fans behind us than did
our opponentsand thismeansa
lot to us."

Coahoma advances Into the
four-tea- Class AA regional in
Lubbock this weekend For
Post, the weekend brought the
opening of the track season

Proceedsof the
game will be split evenly
between the two schools after
paymentof the gameofficials

The Snyder Chamber of
Commerce handled the com-

plete arrangements, including
free programs, and will mail
the checks to the two schools
for their share of the gate
receipts

The Post Antelopes got their
two forwards in foul
trouble Friday night in a
playoff warmup game with the
Petersburg Buffaloes in the
Koosevclt gym and dropped a
58 to 52 decisionto the Class4A

district champs

Another oil well location has
been staked in the Barron
Hanch Held of
Garza County. 15 miles north-
east of Post

It is the Kerr-McGc- c Corp.
No 2 F Swenson which will be
drilled to a 7.900-foo-t depth

Location is 660 feet from
north line and ,ttip feet from

line
the third.

Three Post Does were elected
this week the first
5AA girls basketball two

were named the
second team and a
honorablemention

First team selectionsIncluded
Mel King and Jenda Gllmorc.
forwards and Kim Mitchell,
guard

Hays and Ann Mitchell
were selected for the second
learn and Karen Williams
receivedhonorablemention.

King. Ann Mitchell and
Gtlmore mode selec-

tion last year
other girl on the

first team, chosen by the
coaches,were Scott of Slaton.
Ward of Cooper Itoseberry of
Tahoka Beaver of Fren-ship-,

forward: and Vcntacourt
of Cooper. Mulling! of Fren-

ship Brown of Itooscvclt and
Wolfe and Maxwell both of
Stolon at guards

cither girls on the
alllistnct team included Ho-

ward of Frenship Craig of

Lopes whacked68 to 48 by Coahom

PateS ' - Th Post (Tex.) DrSfkh

Three Lopes

all-distr- ict team

Lopes into foul trouble

and bow to Petersburg

Another well

site staked

Ellcnburger

on

Three of the five starterson
Coach John Alexander's Dis-

trict 5AA champion Post
Antelopes have beenelected by
coachesto the cage
squad.

They are Bryan Davis. Junior
forward and one of the three
unanimous selections: Tony
Conner, senior forward; and
Mike Shepherd, juniorguard.

Twelve were named to

Both Tony Conner and Bryan
Davis fouled out as Petersburg
took a one-poi- lead late in the
third and away In the
fourth against the Lopes'
reducedfire and board power

Mike Shepherd hit for 10

baskets over the Buffalo
defenseto score 22 points and
led Post In scoring

Davis had 11 and Conner 10

Center Mike Waldrlp tallied
four baskets for eight points
Bob Craig got the other point on
a free throw

The Lopesgot only five shots
from the charity line while the
Buffaloes got to toss up 19

unmolested.
The Antelopes trailed 14 to 15

at the end of Ihe first period,
but pulled back to a 27 to 25

..leadat halftime intermission

Tahoka. Campbell of Cooper.
Trammel! of itooscvclt. end
Montgomery and Wright, both
of Slaton. forwards, and Jones
of Cooper. Howell of Frenship.
Waley and Dunlap. both of
Slaton. guards

NKU STUIKVT UKItK
Glenn Huntley and son. Kam.

arrived Friday. Feb 21 from
Guam to spend a few days with
Glenn's parents. Mr and Mrs
Sexton Huntley and Mr and
Mrs. E E Peel Kam will
remain in Post and attend the
Post school for the rest of the
term He is in the eighth grade

Men do not stumble over
mountains, but over molehills.

west of Section "23. 'Block 7. Petersburg went back ahead
H&GN Survey r "'43 to"42 at thtfend of

ThreeDoesnamed
fo all-distri-

ct team
to

team,
ethers to

sixth got
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and

second

the

pulled
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squad this year
becauseof two ties

Other unanimous
selectionswere Bob Woodward,
Frenship senior, and Glen
Campbell. Itooscvclt senior.

All seventeamsin the district
were representedon the squad
with Post the only other team
with three players named.
Denver City, Tahoka, and
Cooper each placed two.

Other membersof the
cage squad arc Tommy

Thornc. Denver City senior;
Cooper lvcy. Denver City
senior: Billy Ray Thomas,
Slaton senior. Tommy Botkin,
Tahoka junior. Curtis Graves,
Tahoka sophomore. Donnle
Scales.Cooper junior, and Jon
Fchlcison. Cooper senior.

Lope track team
in first meet

This is "overlap week" for
the basketball and track
seasons with Coach Lane
Tannchill's defending district
champion Antelopes scheduled
to open their scheduleSaturday
at the Brownficld track meet

The six other teams In Post's
class at Brownficld will include
DenverCity. Frenship. Floy-dad- a.

O'Donncll. Dawson and
the Brownficld JVs

Coach Tannchill reports he
has had 14 track men working
out regularly with most of them
scheduled to sec action Satur-

day. Fourteen other candidates
have been on the varsity and
JV cage squads and whether
several, or any of these will be

in shape to compete Saturday
probably would be Friday

The running preliminaries at
Brownficld will begin at 9:30 a.
m. with the finals scheduledto
start at 2 p m

Over 700 persons
hear Jerry Clower

CKOSBYTON - A record-size-d

croud, estimated at 707

persons, turned out for the
annual Crosbton Chamber of

Commercebanquet a week ago
to hear Jerry Clower. the
nation's No I country humorist
from Yazoo City. Miss.

They were not disappointed
For 55 minutes Clower kept
them roaring with laughter, the
Crifebyton Heview reported last
wevk

Temper Is what gets most of
us into trouble. Pride is what
keepsus there

WHEN A FRIEND'S IN NEED, REMEMBER

CAPR0CK BAIL BOND & SURETY
Offering All Kinds of Bonds. Terms Arranged
GARY HOWELL SamePhone3170 and 2404

WEONLY
j4GRKrUL1URE WEflHER

ON TV XT 6'00& TO'OO

BOB
01urn! lUnfo
28'S METEOROLOGIST

L T2tevision&J:1k1C

Girl tracksters
working out

The Post Docs track squad
began workouts this week for
their spring seasonwhich will
open March 7 with the seventh
eighth and varsity teams
competing at Frenship

Coach John Morrow announc
cd the remainder of the spring
scheduleas follows

March 14, varsity at Spur
March 15. varsity nt Texas
Tech. March 22, varsity at
Olton: March 27. varsity at
Denver City. April Amarll-l- o

Relays. April 9. district meet
for varsity at Frenship. April
18-1- regional meet for varsity
at Odessa. May 2-- statemeet
at Austin

Area town asks
over million

CKOSBYTON - The Crosby-to- n

city council is making
application to the Department
of Housing and Urban Develop-

ment tllUDi for $1,191,000 In

federal grants "for the Im-

provementof public utilities
and services In low income
areas.'

The program. If approved,
would cover a five year period.

Planned arc l approxi-
mately r,o blocks of street
paving with curb and gutter.
2i construction of a new

Umi.ihxi gallon water tower and
water repairs to improve the
town's water pressure and Its
ability to fight fires, and
construction of approximately
34 blocks of sanitar sewer
services into areas of low

income and minorities now
presentl unserved by Ihe
sew'--r svslem

The best wsy to forget vow
own problem i to help someone
solve his.

f
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A bank

Bowen of Plains and granddaughterof Mrs. Wesley Stephensol 3
shows her 991 pound grand steer, Colonel, at the Yoakum CoJ

Livestock Show, Feb. 14.

has beenshowing animals for sevenyears.

Phone
boost reduced
PERRYTON - The Pcrryton

city council last week put off
action on a sharply scaled-dow-

request for a raise In phone
ratesby GeneralTelephone.

The new rotes were from
one-hal-f to one-quart- what the
utility had originally askedand
overall were about one-thir- d of
the original boost sought.

Under the new request
one-part- y business phones
would be increased only $1.50
instead of $5.85, and one-part- y

residential phones would be
hiked only 75 cents instead of
$2.45.

GeneralTelephoneand the
city council disagrees both on
the size of the utility's
investment in Pcrryton and Its
rate of return here.

The phone firm pegs its local
Investment at three million
dollars and its rate of return at
four per cent The city, on the
basis of a study made, contends
the phone system's worth here
is about two million and the
rate of return is 9'i per cent.

A new meeting between
council and phone officials has
been set for this week.

gM

WE TAKE THE
PUZZLE OUT
OF BANKING!
It's more likely at The Best Of
Banks that your can be
time than It to do this

good hasmore

1 1 I

mm

Stephens
champion

rate

Plains biaie tsanK Dougnt me steerlor si a pound.

Gem and mineral show set
2

BIG SPRING -- The annual
Gem, Mineral and Artifact
Show will be held March in
the Dora Roberts Exhibition
Building at the Howard County
Fair & Rodeo Grounds here.
Show hourswill lie from 9 a.m.
to 9 p.m. Saturda and 10 a.m.
to 6 p.m Sunday

In addition to exhibits there
will be working demonstrations
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rrcurded In 1973, but somewhnt
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retire--

of

for the area was 83,000 pounds
per squaro inch In 1970

In grade, 50 per cent of the
nrca crop fell In the White
category, 43.9 per cent was
Light Spot, and S.8 per cent
graded Spot. Corresponding
1973 figures Were 74.7 per cent,
28.7 per cent and 1.5 per cent

III wiivii la ll'lll
was In that grouping The
lowest percentagewas nine per
cent White cotton In I9C6.

Mlcronalrc readings for 1974

averaged3.07 only
slightly above the previous
record low of 2.9 micrograms
established In 1971, and for
below the excellent 1973 crop
when the mlcronalrc

tfflaSnUU 4.13. 1973 was
,L a LI I

VWl Cotton "Barky"

i

tj

.

ruHV

meeting

March

Mom

1974 accounted for34.0 per cent
of the crop, which compares
with only four per cent Darky
cotton in 1973. The worst year
In Plains history for bark was
1971 when CO per cent of the
bales carried that designation.

Prior to 1973, Barky bales
were penalized50 points in the
cotton loan schedule in addition
to being reduced in grade. The
50 point penalty was removed
by USDA In 1973 after PCG
presentedevidence that the
"double penalty" was not
justified by loss of spinningand
finishing utility. Thus the
375,000 plus bales of barky
cotton in 1974 were valuedat an
additional $2.40 each by the
loan schedule.

Two qualify
for state
Several members of the Post

AntelopeBand were in Lubbock
Saturday attending the Region
1G Solo and Ensemble contest
held at Monterey High School.

Those making a Division I

Rating andeligible for the State
contest in Austin in June were;
Class I Solos, Danna Giddcns a
I Rating in Flute and Cy
Willson a I Rating on the
Coronet.

Others placing were Class
HI Solo. Melodic Willson. a I

WefS Tuesday Rating on Piano Solo, Class I

4

HUR.Ko.3)

...

.itUrmlMj

micrograms,

Flute (juartet, uanna uiddens,
Patricia Posey, David Morrow,
and Peggy Jackson, with a I

Rating, and these are all
freshman; Class I Solo with a II
Rating, David Morrow on Flute
and also Class I Solo on the
Piano with a II luting was
David Morrow

to further provide that a
itat-wld- e ayatcm of bene-fi-U

ahall be provided for
officers and employcea of
cltlea which may voluntar-
ily participate.

The wording of the pro-
posed amendmentas it will
appear on the ballot la aa
followa :

"The constitutional
amendmentreviling and
consolidating provisions
relating to stateand local
retirement syatems and
programa and providing
for a maximum atatecon-

tribution to atate systems
of 10 percent of the ag-
gregate compensation
paid to Individuals."

NUMMER TWO
ON THE BALLOT

(IU.R. No. 6)

Amending Article III,
Section 24 of the Texas
Constitution to:

Provide an Increase In
salary for members of the
Legislature from 400 per
month to M per month.

Provide an Increase In
the per diem rata for mem-
bers of the LttfUltture
from $12 to ISO for each
day during each Regular
and Special Seaalon of the
Legialerturt.

Provide an Increase In
the transportation allow-
ance for members fromf.10
per mile to tho rat pre-
scribed by law for em-
ployees of the State of
Texas.

The wording of the pro-
posed amendmentas It will
appear on the ballet Is aa
feUowsi

"The constitutional
amendment setting the
seiariee of members of
the legislature at (600
per month and setting a
per dim at ISO per day
dttlng WMUive eesaiena
and a mtteag allowance
at the mm rata provided
by law for atate

jPJSCOM ti T C E W Ti 11
121 N. BROADWAY

miiiiimhi imimmiin mamamtaa

Prices Good For One Big Week
Starting Thursday,Feb. 27 thru Wed., March 5

1
Polaroid

SX-7- 0 Film

REG. $5.88

Polaroid

Colorpack

Film
Type 108

REG. $4.69

I 553) I fc- -J

Ray-O-V- ac

GENERAL
PURPOSE

"C" OR "D"

Batteries
Vz Volts

Reg. 2 for 49c

KNIT
100 Pet. Polyester

Choice: or Short Sleeves
Open Neck or Turtleneck

Choice of Colors

PRICES

Women's

Sleeveless

TO S4.97, NOW.

Bounty PaperTowels
Absorb like magic! Gels up spills fast!

Strong too! 100 Sq. Feet, 120 sheets in Jumbo Roll

GIBSON'S REG.
53c, NOW

DAYTIME

Pampers
With Cushion Fit Tapes,
Especially designedfor
babiesover 11 pounds

CompleteDiaper - No Pins
No Plastic Pants Needed

30 In Box

Gibson's
Reg. $2.29.,

PEAK

DIAL

if IXltTTiimtirji

ENRICHED

I1 2 Loaves

Anti-Freez- e & Coolant
Guaranteed protection. In winter protects against
freeze-ups- . In summer, protects against boil-ove- Protects
full-tim- e against rust and corrosion.

Gibson's
Reg. $4.37,

or

SHASTA

12 Oz. Cans
Regular or Diet

2--34C 7--$1.00

COCA COLA

SPRITE

REG.
$22.97

iniiumuHmimmuuuimmumimiuil

TOPS

Canned Drinks

12 Oz. Cans
Gibson's
Reg.
25c Can.,...

2 Rolls 880

ttirtr

Gibson's

Lb.

2--690

$3.99 Gal.

Casual or Work

SHOES
Choice of Solid Colors

ye Tie Styles

REG. $4.99

Men's Ranch

Wellington Boots
All Leather Uppers

CompositionSoles
No. 555

495-226-8

Women's

COLT

COBRA
38 Special

Now $127.99
Troopr MK III
Colt 357 Mag.
4" Barrel, NOW

DICKIES

MENS'

WESTERN

STYLED

LEISURE

SUITS

Choice of Fabrics
with Contrasting
Stitching on Top

and Pantsl

REG. $22.?

$17.88

,
NOW YOU CAN LAND SOME BIG

ZEBCO 404

Fishing Reel
Absolutely no backlash,trouble--
free, ruggedly built, fast line

for 15 Lb. Line

REG.
$4.97, NOW

$175.00

dependable

GIBSON'S

Supply

pickup control,

Collapsible Wire Fishing

BASKET
Flosts to Keep the Fish You Catch

GIBSON'S REG.
$4.99, NOW

5
No. 132, Hook sizes 1 & 2, 20 lb. test.

REG. 29c

Twtti stol sharp
petalsi stfwif rIm SfttH$e

Ast. Sim, 6 hks to f . REG. 22c

$3.88
J0RGENS0N CRAPPIE RIGS for
GIBSON'S $1.00

JORGENSONFINEST QUALITY SNELLED HOOKS
hwks, (tmhhI

heiiWtwdi

CIISON'S

Men's Roughout

Wellington Boots
All Leather Man-Mad- e

He. 544

REG.
$11.97,

White Lasts!

REALLY

instant

JBfctafc



Mgtot. Industriesearningsdrop 67 per cent for quarter
of .l.munrv h,n

this trend
current adverse luw

conditions,someelements
Burlington's business

well Mr Jones said
have remained strong,
carpels and industrial
have fared Inner than

pattern Hi ulrled

Greensboro. N C At the the month
Burlington Industries annual continued

D
meeting here recently. T'rilr-ma- n Despite

Horace C. Jones told iness

Shareholdersthat the Company of
business held up

picture" for about three quart-
ers

denims
of its 1974 fiscal year, but in and that

late summer businessbegan to products
weaken. the Industry

"Our last fiscal quarter In
1974. endtng In September,
showed a decreasein earnings

i that reflected the softening
,n trend," he said (Sales for the
d year ending September2B. 1974.

4 reached an all-tim- e record of
$2.3 billion and earnings in-

creased1 to a record $3.0.1 per
fc share.)
:i Mr. Jones said that during
M 1974, "inflation erodedconsum-

ers' purchasingpower and they
t becameincreasingly apprehen-

sive."b Also retailers and other
)1 Burlington customers found
!l themselves with too much

')( Inventory, and the housing
1( industry went Into a steep

decline. These events all
V affected textile sales and
n contributed to mounting reces-

sion, he added.
b "The results of our operations
i In the December quarter, the
V first in our 197S fiscal year,
Jl reflect all of the problems we
h are experiencing.Sales were

$502 million, a 7 5 percent
)t decline from the same quarter
r of the previous year, and
e earnings declined 62.5 percent
T! to 33 cents per share. The

overall pattern of business in
)l

l

Group called
I

1

( home by storm
(

By BRYAN DAVIS
Saturday,Feb. 22, 5:30 a. m.

27 sleepy studentsand six tired
sponsorswaded through snow
and ice to board a cold bus to
go to theStamford UIL practice
meet. After two hours of
driving, the 27 stunnedstudents
arrived In Stamford ready to
compete.

The speechstudents went to
the First Baptist Church, in
downtown Stamford to compete
in their different events. The
remaining students met in the
study hall, library and different
rooms of the high school
building for their various
events.

About 10 a. m. they received
an urgent phone call from

'51 Principal Hahn saying, "Head
heme, we have a bUzxard
In Post."

After a hurried lunch, they
1 got on the bus and headedfor
I home. The group was more
3 alert coming back than they
i were going The trip was
1 enjoyed by all and when they

: reachedhome they found more
snow than ice.

4

I 41 Roundup
1 SOUTHLAND SCHOOL NKWS

Coming Kvrnti
Feb. 1 - Outsiders

Basketball Tournament, spon-
sored by the senior class.

Mar 1 - UIL High School
Meet at Cooper,beginning at 7
a. m.

Mar 7-- 8 Texas Tech Stage
Band Festival. Lubbock.

Mar. 8 High school trip to
Odessa to see "West Side
Story" at the Globe of the Great
Southwest.The Play beginsat
8:30 p. m.

Cooper Meet
Fourteen Southland high

school studentswill complete in
nine contestsat the Cooper UIL
Meet Saturday. Mar 1.

1 Curt Wheeler. Kendon Wheel-jer-,

and Nathan Wheeler are
entered in number sense.
Nedra Myers, Mary Buxkempcr

Jand Kelly Chaffln poetry
interpretation. Donna Shelton
and Curt - slide rule; Amanda

jWheeler - shorthand; Randy
Thomas, Reagan Dlckerson,

-- and Mary Ann Vasquex
ready writing, Nathan Dicker-ji-

and Jenny Wheeler
feature writing; Mark Bevers

jwwl Kemien Wheeler - head-M-e

writing, Randyand Aman-!- d

editorial writing; Curt and
! Amanda - spelling and plain
writlM . and Krnilnn anri

Mwswriting,
Henry Hunter, math teacher;

Miss Lynn Heith, business
tCM --ml Mr. 1 Aura In

tWheeler. English and Journal-
ism

IV

teacher,aresponsorsof the LUr

wove students
Registration begins at 7 a. m. L ifollowed by a general meeting

at The contestswill start
at 8 a m A school bus will
transport the students to and
from the meet.

Basketball
The high school boys played

their last game at
Meadow Feb. 18. Larry Koslan

i was high scorer with 26 points.
r Mark Bevers scored 13 points,
S and Kendon Wheeleradded 11.

f Meadow won the game.
t Th boys" last heme game
I was with Sundown Feb. 20.
J Sundewawen the gam MH9.

Koalas scored 17 points;
Wheeler made 13 and Bevers

1

have

here

Jonnv

7:30.

that good turn.ii the
making fur mi ..n n ,
hosiery operation. , i .mr
knits and textured i n-- . iKie
also continued to perform
well "

The compaiiv ha a strong
and aggri'iNitc program un
derwav to iopc with the
seriously depressed economy

WITH

THESE

COUPONS

--JHlilllc

the purchase pricect lour (4) 1 2 ox
Cans PtKgly Wiggly TeasStyle

Biscuits
5181

Coupon Eipires March 1 1975.

twtiniiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiniiiiimiiiiiii
itiiii,i m

flfffVI
the purchaseprice ol one( 1 ) 20--

Pkg. Hetty

TrashBags
5191

Coupon Expires March 1 1975

Ibllllllllllilllllllllllllllllllllllli5i
.III I' him n..:,J..

CoU
the purchaseprice ol one (1)10 lb.
Bag Flour

GoW Medal 8092J -

520
Coupon Capites March 1. 1975

Hi 1 1 1 1 ! Ill 1 It 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

rTTTTTTTTT

the purchaseprice ot one (11 8 or
Btl, Any flavor

7 SeasDressing,
Coupon Expires March 1 1975 521

Iwllllllllllllllllimillllllllllllllll
iaHllllllll' "'I

the purchaseprice ol one ill 2 Ph
8 ol Sleeve Solt

Chiffon Heo
S" fc

Couaon toresMarch I 1975

blllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllrfcz

10 Off
the purchaseprice ot one ID S ot
oi Batty Crocker Instant

PotatoBuds
Coupon Expires March 1 1975.

4 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

fflliTFTr TTll

21 Off
the purchaseprice ot one the
111 Any flavor tli 12

Mayer

Parfatt lZB3

Coupon tipires IB1 Coupon

-- -r m

W
March i. 1973.

fifliiiiJJiiiiM

i'

March

In addition to reducing inven-
tories and overhead cost. Mr
Jonessaid Burlington is ailing
to increase productivity con-
tinuing Company witlo energy
conservation: and conducting
nn intensive marketing elfort
that includes new and freshly
designedproducts

Mr Jones said that gradual

Superb Valu Trim,
Heavy Aged Beef

Round
Steak

Lb.
USDA GradeA, y

Cut-U- p Fryers lb.
USDA Crade A, 3 to Avtraie
Fresh Baking Chicken Lb.

U58A Crade A

Fryer Drums or Thighs lb.
trade A n

Cornish Game Hens J
--

70-of.l

SUeJ

Cridt A, 6 to Avtrajre

Turkeys for BBQing lb.
rreth

Chicken Livers lb..
CradeA, Cut Up. Frozen

Stewing Chicken lb.

USDA Grade A, Legs or Breasts

Fryer
I(IH1! IUI O Lb.

I
A.

Superb Valu-Tri- m, Heavy Aged

Rib Steak
88c

SuperbVaki Trun,Heavy Aitd Seel

Boneless Rib Steak lb.
SuperbValu Trim. Heavy Aged Beel

Boneless Club Steak ib
SuperbValu Trim, Heavy Aged Beel. CenterCut

Chuck Roast
SuperbVu Trim, Heavy Aged Beel. Round Bene

Shoulder Roast
Freien

Turbot Fish Fillets

FisfcTtlcks
P'U'y Vviggiy, Uneeoded.Freren.

Ocean Fillet Perch lb
Sue V4-Tri- Heavy Aged Beel

Swiss
Steak lb.

purchaseprice ot onebq

litres
1. IJ7J

mm

Coupon Capnea
March I

nr

signs of improvement in
textile lndintr begin lo
show later this jenr. He
some areas ol Ihe Company's
business are experiencing a
bottomlngout with ome very

preliminary s'Rns of a recov
cry

We look for no dramatic
turnaround In textile or the

Beef

1.39

1.89
99c

--1.09
..89c

1.11

thepurchaseprice ol one
ot Pi Oscar in or Btl weiia Her

bal Normal, Dry Oily

Slcs Blossoms

;!iriiiiiiiiiiiiinuim

104
1979.

umiiiimmiftui-- rfi

the
ma

said

The Post (Tex.) Dispatch Thursday,Feb; 27,1975 Pe jq
general cowwm run Wnevc
that thofP will lx it uradwil
Improvement In our business
in the latter Iwll of IVnr1itjji..n
fiscal yenr Mr. .lone wild

Vc also expect that tiov
ernmcnt nctlons on In relief
nnd a less restrictive monetary
policy will begin to improve
coruumer confidence."

He added that 'while up do
not deceive ourselvesor try to
dectevo anyone else a lo the
severity of the current decline

m
I.M-- l-l

i.iu.,M!ii.i -

5-L- b. Chub Pack

Ground
Beef

Lb.
ChucK Quality

Lean Ground Beef
CoarseGround lor Chill

Lean Ground Beef
lean

Beef Short Ribs
USDA Choice, Heavy Aged Beit, Blade Cut

Chuck Roast
lean, Boneless

Stew Beef
Shinned fc Develned

Fresh Calf Liver
Fresh

Beef Tongues

SuperbValu-Tri- Heavy Aged Beef

Chuck
Steak Lb.

Superb Valu Trim, Heavy Aged Beef,
Doneiess

Chuck Roast

Lb.
leo's. 9 Varieties

Wafer Thin Lunchmeats
leo't, 16 oi. I.3S

Pimento Cheese
Decker

Jumbo Franks
Cracker Site

Decker Texas Cervelat
He. t Quality

Decker Slice Bacon
Smoke Sausage

Hot Link
Heat L Serve

93c Eckrich Smoked Sausage
Owen's

Country
lt fg 7 3?1

Sausage
miii-rifeiii-

iir

40c0ff
the purchaseprice done
111 t fkt Twin Blade
Cartridges

GMsnom Tracl
91 Coupon lipnes 911

March 1. 197$.

In Kiilf, MA.i i..fftrrft..
have not lost our Confidence In
mc luiure vintiiwy of the
united Mutes eefmomv r of"Burlington

More people rend personal

b

MM.

items man else, call sion h ST'"Tyour news to Dispatch. Texasta

Year I

. .
eontK work while you reductionsleep, call 2flie. Hcntlv

m ,ht

EH

iif.r.ii.i -iaf.TO a

All Grinds

limit intll)
with $7 SO
t mort

purcluti
tidumclirint.

Folgtr's

Coffee

lb. Bonne, Heavy Duty, laundry

Detergent
lb.

lb.
Liquid Bleach
Pinty Wiggty, Macironi and

lb. CheeseDinner
Piggly Wiggly

Panei Z
lb. 145-C- t.

TowelsRolls
1 Ply

Cans

Effective
3 or.

HjKII,

BSH
8ood,h,'

Instant

---- eil

Chunk Style

Del Monte
Tuna

Antiseptic $199
Listerine r I

lb.

lb.
L

'V."1.09
If II I

lb.

Regular er Mint

Crest 7or
Tube

Too ste
mm'

ft 50c
the purchasepriceol one
ttiPt

SpiHhS

Bulls
Coupon tiptiot Sit Coupon

Match t. 1973. TiH March I

.a.'W Stsi.."I "

anything
The

6V-o- z.

i "ininFmi

2.09

49-0-

C

Off
Ihepurchaitp""9""

ROM

Busites
ti('

:1iiiniiiiiiii



Menus

tr. ,..iei, cheese

75ke cookie.

nd beans
J 7,ffed celery

Assorted

Lady

tun

Ctn.

Qt.

Jar

''UtMM

liri

Pie

-- w iirai

Wednesday: Krlto pie, lettuce
salad, buttered corn, purple
plum,cornbread,half pint milk.

Thursday: Teachcri Work
Day. No ichool.

Friday: Teacher work day,
no school.

J4eiplla(Totci
Those admitted to Oarza

Memorial Itosfl'al since Tues-

day of last week were
Auda Vec Vaughn,medical
ClarenceDcnzy. medical
Orby Whltten, medical

S9

Flavors

Alice
Mellonine

Coke or Sprite

$189
32-0- PIUS

BUS rjCp0Sit

Del Monte, Pineapple-Grapefru-it or

Orange 2 Cf
Drink ts-- v

Carol Ann

Classic Pizza
I r

7 iat
g.

Brownies

n-
-' ioo pun riMife, nwM

a

Hilt

2.09

1.25

wMgejiiice 63c

".MVifittlM

tanson OCC
PfMi.l

ot 8kirt

or

low

- w

100

I I

I 1000 I

with tht ot em
(1) 10 oi Btl. vaseiwt
lotion

FTV tpti
March 1. 1875,

Ruby Abraham,medical
Mary Wclborn, medical
Lonnle Wclborn. medical
Esther Ward, medical
NannieCooper, medical
Michelle Soils, medical
John Harrison,medical
Ilada Person,medical
Bill Carlisle, medical

Dismissed
Hobby Ammons
Alcnrda Gomez
Frclda t'oston

Harrow
Ftuby Abraham
narenccucnzv

5
Kins

Rome Apples

Lbs.

Boom flavors el

Tangy Lemons
Spicy Flavor

Limes
Tropical Flavor

Sweet Pineapple
PltasantChawing

Meaty Coconuts
Luscious

Juicy Oranges
Red Golden

Delicious
Apples

A Calorie Dttstrt

D'Anjou Pears

Raattmon

Fruit

SM

Coupon

Nettie

Treat Red

Sunflower Seeds

Juice
Nature'sZipper

Juicy
Tamtarines

lOIl

purchaie

isniiwvs
Care

Lemon

3p

The Pol (Tex.) TftrWiy, Fe4. V, 1975 fm

tofHc NmMl
Edgar Fox, First

Church ha tmmmc
that his sermon title tor

coming will "Uek
Inn as OthersView
Us." This Sunday will also be
Doy Scout Sunday

A slide series
which

tells about the work the

of C

California

Othtr roods

Tart

For

For

is

the

lb.

5 a

Ruby

Minister,
Christian

Sunday,
Ourselves

entitled:
"Journey Witness,"

Prime Source Vitamin

Produce!
WlgglyJ

1

1-8-

9

Breakfast

Crispy-Fres-h

lb.

Jib.

JWoz.

lis WWWKmfK

r8WM rOOa
StampCustomers

1D01AM
iOreen
with th purchattot two

(2)rH 48

V

h.

ed
be

at

of
of

f framPigglv

Lb.

lb.

Sill

StaWnHEP

Hw'tlrup
Soetsn

Ceuaontipirot i
Match t, nix

Lb.

Christian Church In the chang.
Ing world will be shown at the 7
p. m. worship hour.

Mrs. Levi Williams nameWas
accidentally left off the list of
persona taking part In the Day
of Prayer at the First Chrittlan
Church, Saturday, Feb 15. She
wai one of the 22 memberswho
helped make the day a success.

Been somewhere' Had com
pany' Call your news to 2816.

StandartIn Salad, Hearty

Cabbage

Mak a Squash Pit, TfMow or

Italian Squash
Halo Maka a Tattv Slow

Waxed Rutabagas
Rich In VMimlnj

Nutritious Broccoli
For Tht Calorit Conscious

Cool Cucumbers

Clip-T- op Turnips
For A Satislylni VuttaWt Entrtt

Firm Eggplant
A Universal Flavoring

Yellow
Onions

Easy to Prepare,Firm

Cauliflower

Lb.

Goldtn Swttt Mt
Texas Yams
AM Color To SalMk

Red Cabbage
Tht Vigttablt Pawtihautt. rrtmiwm

RussetPotatoes
Gsuffnet'sOiMght

WhitR

TTTTi

brooms

250SUt

with tht purchast ol two
(2) 40-l- lags

Peat

Couma lipirts
j March 1 1975.

lb.

lb.

lb.

lb.

lb.

WeGive
SUI

GreenStamps

StanptH
m

D. C
Every In the world,

our own, has hadits
national police and

Our own country
through wars and crime waves
without either a CIA or FBI We
did, during the

have

S&H

Green
with tht purchastot ont
(1) 18 ot rotate or

Mad

As It Looks From
WASHINGTON,

country
Including

Intelligence
operations

muddled

however,
American Revolution,

m

50

Coupon ipini
March 1 1875

Piggly Wiggly

secret Intelligence operations.
TheodoreRoosevelt founded the
bureau which
preceded the FBI by some
years.

Now. with the trend towards
liberalism, there are those who
have sound reason to want to
dismantle all our Intelligence
ageniccs Just recently, the old

1100
S&H

Green
Stamps

with these
coupons

.'F,!!'-lv.'u'- l

100
GreenStamps

i,n ,ne purchaie ol one ( 1 ) 1 6 oz.
Jar

of
30

f!nff in) foeamap1
- Pniinnn fvnirat. Mara! 1 1011 534, r- - IM

iiniiniiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiirKtsa

100 S&H

GreenStamps
with the purchaie ol live (S) 16-o- r

Cans Piggly Wiggly

Vegetables
Coupon Expires March 1, 1975.

runmni

Investigation

Get

S&H

100 S&H

GreenStamps
wtth tht purchaseol one (1) 25-lb- .

Bag Oog Food

ChuckWagon
Coupon Expires March 1, 1975

;iiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiuiiii

50 S&H

GreenStamps
with the purchait ol one(1)
ISO Ct Pkg Sandwich Bags

Baggies
Coupon Cipirts March 1 1975.

50 S&H

GreenStamps
with tht purchase ot ont (II
18'voi Boi Duncan Hints layer

CakeMix
Coupon lipirts March t, 1975.

1111111111

50 S&H

GreenStamps
with tht purchast ot ont (11 10-o-

Phg Morton's

PotatoWaves
Coupon liputs March 1 1875.

lira
Staiml

v,i'''iv:'ii;';alTTlTITTT

50 S&H

GrtM
with tht purchast ol ont
ill 1G oi Clovtr't Ctr
man

Smoke

lllllU't.,!

Coupon Eiputt tC
March 1 1875

mi

laiifl

UnAmericart Activities Comrriil
tee In the House of Reprcscrill-live- s

was scuttled by the New
Congress.Under the Influence
of Watergate, the CIA is under
attack for conducting domeslft
surveillances, an authorRV
which was never Intcndc'd.
Neither had the times of (He

CO's been Intended or ever
expectedwhen the thousands'
revolutionaries (their oth
term) marched In Washington
and other cities across trie
Country. The question whs
always wheredid they get their
finances.Peoplewho apparent-
ly lived well didn't come here
from the four comers of (he
Nation by airplane for nothing.
It may be an oversimplification
but the role of the CIA, at that
time, was to try to find (rut
what foreign connections the
leaders of these revolutionary
groups may have had 'in
financing theseactivities. '

Special committees of both
the house and the Senate'Hie
being formed to Investigate
both the CIA and FBI. These
agencieshave grown to mass-
ive size and arc accusedof a
serious challenge to popular
freedom.

The FBI is now chargedwith
assemblinginformation suchas
has come its way on Members
of Congress. The CIA 'Is
chargedwith having kept a file
on 10,000 or more Americans'In
the course of trying 'to
determine if the war protestsof
the 1960's were inspired or
financed form foreign sources,
and to what extent.

As yet, there is no sighted
instance of any member of
Congressbeing intimidated by
the FBI, nor any war demo-
nstrator having been unduly
hounded by the CIA. It could
have happened in isolated
Instances without shaking the
foundations ofthis Republic.

As far as congressmenarc
concerned, theyarc no less free
of peculiarities, and have
human behavior like anyone
else, but, although some arc
suspiciousthat they may have
been Investigated, nothing
shows up yet that any such
information was formally soli-
cited but only that which came
to them by reference.

The point is, that our high
crime rate, and the foment in
the country, will continue as
opportunity presents Itself, but
there are those in this
increasingly assertive and per-
missive Democratic society,
who seem to think there is"a
threat of oprfreySMn when laws
arc enforced or investigations
arc madeof actions designed to
overthrow and subvert this
nation.

Demands are now heard in
the congress,from people and
organizationsaround the coun-
try, that there should be no
confidentiality in theseagencies
and other intelligence opera-
tions in our governmentfor fear
of repressiveaction. Nothing is
perfect and it is entirely
possiblethat a reorganization,a
restatement of aims and
principles should be redefined
to guide these operations. It
would, however, be disastrous
and make ineffective

and hamper ef-

forts to guard against insecur-
ity for this country. If total
control and publicity of our
intelligence activities were im-

posedby the Congress. If this
should happen, we can forget
about conducting investigations
necessary to our internal
security There is a limit on
secrecy and sensible men
shouldapply it. But to open up
every aspectof theseagencies
would not only impair our
ability for law enforcement but
preventour beingable to obtain
knowledge of subversive influ-
encesInspired from abroad.
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At Most notable characteristics
for breeding bulls not neces-
sary In beef cattle include; a
masculine appearance,breed
markings, constitution and a
Kod welght-to-ag-e ratio.
CONSTITUTION Usually
described as the positive
tendency or an animal to per
form well and survive during
advancedage. Physical charac--'
tcrtttlcs Indicative of a good
constitution are full develop--,

mcnt of the iorcquartcrs.wide--

open and broad nostrils, a
strong straight back and good
body width anddepth
MASCULINITY Evidenced
by the appearanceof the bull,
General featuresto look for are
a full neck stronghorns Iwhen
this ts a breed characteristic),
full forehead with good
development of chest and
shoulders.

GARZA COUWY BRANCH

LATON
SAVINGS
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hamberbanquet---
L'ontinurd From PageOnri
platform at the west end of
e aym was a beautiful in n

frfoot American flag made of
2?cpe paper stuffed by the
(lou!iands Into a chicken wire
ihrSmc.
fiThc flag was the major
jUxoratlon for the banquet
jpTCentennlal theme It was
jnlc by the Women'sDivision

f,the Chamberwith the help of
plumber directors and Junior
Hilh studentswho helped stuff
iji the crepepaper during their
5jffperiod
! Members of the high school
tfra'ma classpresentedtake-off- s

from American history uslnit a
"You are There" theme during
The' meal with the spotlighted
presentationmadeabove the
Qanquct crowd In the south
teachers.

i-- Studentsparticipating includ-

ed Kent Klrkpatrick, Nan Hair,
fjaricy Reno. Kim Hester.
Tracy McAlister. Wayne Joy-iter.a-

Becky Heaton.
I The take-off- s pictured the
'tloston Tea Party. Patrick
"tfenry'sspeech,Betsy Ross and
hc new flag, the signing of the
declaration of Independence,
Oie GettysburgAddress, plus a
special tribute to George
Washington with flashbacks to
Ihc cherry tree Incident, the
grossing of the Delaware, and
Washington as the father of his
.country.
1 Ntrs. Maxine Marks madethe
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announcementof the woman
of the year" award to Mrs
Williams using a love song
theme and telling hnw Mrs
Williams came tu Ganacounty
to teachin a smalt rural school,
married n dashing young
doctor, raised three fine child-
ren, and has led a long and
useful life of service to this
community

Curtis Hudman in the presen-
tation of the "Man of the year"
award to Runkles noted that
flunkies, who recently retired
as camp ranger at Boy Scout
Camp Post, "influenced the
lives of many boys and men"
through his Scoutwork

Hudman traced Runkles ca-

reerthrough Boy Scouting from
the time he was a scout himself
through being an outstanding
scoutmaster and then serving
as the camp ranger here

Runkles also was cited for his
archeologlcal work, discovery
of theGarzapoint from a Carta
Indian excavation, his help to
Dr Fred Wendorf of Texas
Tech in organizing the South
Plains ArcheologlcalSociety in
19S7, his membership In the
GarzaCounty Historical Survey
Committee since Its organiza-
tion In 1962, and his present
post as president of the Garza
County Museum Association
which he helped to organize In
1971

Tom and Janey Mlddleton
and their daughter. Jana,were
presented a plaque as "farm
family of the year" by
Alexander.

Alexander noted In making
the presentationthat Mlddleton
ranches 5,760 acres, is a
director of the Garza Soil and
Water Conservation District
and vice president of its board
of directors, was named "out-
standing ConservationRancher
for GarzaCounty" in 1971, and
completed his Great Plains
ConservationProgram contract
Dec 31, 1974.

Jordan gave the banquet
crowd a strong Chamberof
Commerce orientated talk in
which hechallengedhis hearers
to be good community boosters.

ChambersecretaryJoy Greer
was presentedwith a bouquetof
roses for her work for the
organizationduring the year

Spanishspeaking to
name board member

All Spanish speaking people
of Garza county are invited to
attend a meeting to learn about
government programs and to
elect board membersfor Garza
County Community Action, that
will be your representatives.

The meeting will be held
March 10, at 7:30 p. m in the
Alexander Center. 630 Oak
Street

Giving Our Very Best
By Metzger

There is an old Gospel hymn en-

titled: "Give of Your Best to the
Master," and calls for us to respond to
the grace of God by giving Him our
very best. Often, however, I am afraid
we are like the people fn a little story
that comes out of Europe.

It seemsthat the membersof the
congregation of a little church had
become so Interested In other things
that they neglectedtheir religious faith
except on High and Holy Days.

A crisis developed when the
visiting pastor was to serve the Holy
Communion,and there was no wine in
the church cask. Word quickly spread,
and It was decided that each family
would bring someof Its very best wine

Attend the Church of
Nelson & Garage

510 N. Broadway Ph. 4M-2S3-6

ALL KINDS OF AUTOMOTIVE RKPAIRS
KLWOOD A KICKY NKLSON

Post InsuranceAgency
IIAKOLl) LUCtAS

in E. Main Ph. ttS-Stf-

INSUKK TODAY HK AKCURE TOMORROW

Higginbotham-Bartlet- t
HQS. Broadway Ph

We FurnishYour Hemefrom Planato Paint"

RETIRES AT POSTEX Barney Martin, center, Is

retirementfrom Postex Plant after 22 yearsof service
Tom A. Drake, far left, and Tom Price, far right.

Lavelle's Shop
closed here

Lavelle's Shop was closed
hereSaturday night after about
31 years of operation

The shop is owned by Mrs.
Ruth Lavcllc Bennettof Crosby-ton-,

formerly of Post, and for
the last nine years has been
operated by her father. Oliver
V. McMahon Mrs. Bennettand
her mother openedthe shop In
1944.

It will be the "second
retirement" for McMahon who
retired Dec 31. 1965. after 47

years and nine months service
with the postaldepartment.

Mrs Bennettsaid the remain-
ing stock hasbeen sold.

The Dispatchhas learned the
building is scheduled to be
remodeledwith a new business
to open In it in a month or
more.

Stock sho-w-

Continued From PageOne)
beef cattle will be shown
Saturday morning, beginning at
9 a. m.

Whetheror not there will be a
horse show will depend upon
the interest shown. To date only
one horse is entered. If there
are enoughentries for a horse
show it will start at 2:30 p. m
Friday.

Weight limits for this year
are 850 to 1,250 pounds for
steers, 220 to 22S pounds for
light weight barrows and 225 to
250 pounds for heavy weight
barrows. Gilt weights will be
150 pounds until bred. Lambs
must weigh between75 and 120
pounds.

Gardening tips on fertilizer
COLLEGE STATION --

Home gardensareappearing In
backyard, flower beds and on
patio all over Texas. And with
continued high fertilizer costs
due to low supplies.' home
owners should give special
attention to conserving fertili-
zer

Stun Cotner. vegetable
specialist with the Texas
Agricultural Extension Service,
offers these suggestions:

1 Have soil tested. Many
home gardens arc already

Meeting tonight on
store front changes

All merchantsarc invited to a
7 pm. meeting in the bank
community room tonight to
hear a presentation on store
front remodelingand downtown
modernization

Jim Brahc with Remodel
Sales in the United States and
Canadawill be here to discuss
the subject and presenta film.

The meeting is sponsoredby
the PostChamberof Commerce
and all interested persons are
invited.

Band Boosterswill
meet Monday at 6

The Band Boosterswill hold a
meeting, Monday, March 3 at 6
p m in the Band Hall,
according to Band Director.
Scott Houston. A film of the
marching contestwill be shown
and plans will be madefor the
fund raising for the upcoming
spring band trip.

All band parents and anyone
interestedin helping is askedto
be present for this important
meeting

Ken

Son

and pour it into the cask as the service
began. In this way therewould be wine
without cost to any of them. It was
agreedby common consent.

The service began, and the pastor
filled the silver chalice from the cask.
He carried it to the altar for
consecration, and served it to the
people. A "miracle" or more properly
and "unmlracle" had taken place. The
wine was only water! A bewildered
congregationpartook of the breadand
water in painful silence. What had
happened? Had the Lord turned their
wine Into water?Or could someonehave
given water saved the best wine for
himself?

What do we do with our best?

Your ChoiceSunday

i t i I-- I II I

congratulated on his
Congratulating him Is

fcrlile enough to produce good
yields of most vegetablecrops.
Soil samplesmay be sent to the
Soil Testing Laboratory at
Texas A&M University Infor-

mation Is available at any
county Extensionoffice

2 Apply only light applicat-

ions of fertilizer at planting
time. In absenceof a soil test,
use to three
pounds of n complete fertilizer,
such as or

per 100 square feet of
garden area. Thoroughly mix
the fertilizer with the soil. Use
organic fertilizer and compost
wheneverpossible

3 If at nil possible, use mulch
in the garden to aid In moisture
retention and to prevent leach-

ing of plant nutrients
4. If vegetableplants appear

to grow slouly or lack good
color, sidedress lightly with a
quick-actin- g fertilizer.

Strawn sole owner
of oil servicefirm

Jim Strawn announced this
week he has purchased Earl
Chapman's interest in the
Strain-Chapma- Transport and
Acid, Inc., andhasrenamedthe
business,Strawn Transport and
Acid Co.

Strawn moved to Post from
Abilene in December of 19C7

with Dow Chemical and
retired from that firm In May
of 1973. He and Chapman then
bought out Hill & Hill from D
C iBilly) Hill.
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belong io uinlmdy " llnw to
catch them and disposeof Ihcm
has been a problem back, no
doubt into the far shadowsof
antiquity

-- O-

We can hope the "dog
boosters' (They don't have a
name ct we're told) don't
destroy the system locally
without coming up with some-
thing belter - that thecity can
afford

-- 0-

A newspaperfriend sent Us a
clip from the El PasoTimes of
Feb 12 and Mrs. C. R. Wilson
brought In a page from the San
Antonio Express-New-s of Feb.
I.

-- O-

You probably noted In The
Dispatch not long ago that
Georgehasjust passedhis 90th
birthday.

-- O-

That was a great story about
George iScolty) Samson and
Post City which was an
AssociatedPress feature to all
the dailies of Texas a coupleof
weeks ago. complete with a
picture of Scotty In front of the
C W Post statue.

-- O-

The Dispatch today on Its
editorial page is Introducing a
new columnist and a new-colum-

He is Kurt E. Johnson
and his column Is "statebcat."

-- O-

Thls is a column about Texas
by a Texan. The column is new
to him just as It wilt be new to
us and new to our readers. It
will be written from Austin
weekly.

-- 0-

Kurt is n graduate of Texas
Lutheran College and hasbeen
freelancing since 13 in addi-

tion to working for the Seguin
(Texas) Enterprise.

-- 0-

In his first column this week,
Kurt deals with the Texas
legislature's failure to submit a
constitution to the voters last
year and the prospects for
future success.Next week he is
writing about the plight of the
Texas farmer and the week
after that his subject will be
about the problems of process-
ing social security cases in
Texas with a tot of Info most of
us know nothing about.

-- 0-

Wc hope he finds "the
groove." The Dispatch for
years has beenlooking for a
good Texas column out of the
capital city. We're hoping
"statebcat"Is it.

Thanking salespersonafter
a purchase often rrsults In
more pleasant service to others.
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Fair to
be 6-- 8

annual tinrzu
March anil

Home Demonstration
Council clubs sponsor

vltuscs
clothing, craft, handwork
culinary, canning, flowers, an-
tiques,agricultural products,

men's division.
articles exhibited must made

person exhibiting
Ullelcs have been

shown previous years,
Knlrlcs brought

building belwccn
Thursday.

March Except
youth oniric accepted

Wednesday
March

director Fnye
Payton, Other committee mem-
bers Hcne Fluttt. Vlvn
Davis Orctn Hcvcrs.

Algerita
ContinuedFrom Page

Duncan Muckelroy Austin,
heads grntm section

hixtnrirnl
pnmmiilrp. Inltift Slnton

onntfrn!lnn Spade

Aliinrlln annie Itattufr

structure "restored."
According ttorcn.

Muckelroy federal
funds could obtained
almost total restoration

hotel could
admitted national histori-
cal register

estimates
restoration Informa-

tion entry
national registry
office Monday

Borcn wanted
confer Mayor Giles

McCrary matter before
taking action. mayor

Tuesday.

Firemen
(ContinuedFrom Page

dinner recognition given
department.

Bouchicr, charter
Hotarian. conclu-

sion program recall
member

volunteer department
years

pumpers
pulled hand fires,"

recalled.
volunteers coats

helmets served
firemen
years.

type
helmets which have been
purchased department

displayed. fact, Presi-
dent Bruton asked,

have right?"
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