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Patriots Take Third At Kress; 
Play At Tulia This Weekend 

WAYLAND EDITOR HONORED—

Eddie Owens (right), editor of 

Wayland Baptist College's student 

newspaper, "The Trail Blazer," du-

ring 1975-76, was recognized this 

week for his contribution to the 

publication. He was presented a 

bound copy of all issues during 

his tenure, complete with his name 

All-District Football 

Selections Named 
District 2-B North Zone all-dis-

trict football selections were an-
nounced this week and six mem-
bers of the Valley High Patriots 
were selected for the mythical 
team, four on offense and two on 
the defensive lineup. 

The offensive selections are 
Rex Fuston, center; Darrell Dowd, 
running back; Ron Eudy, quarter-
back and Kenny Chandler, tight 
end. 

All-district defensive selections 
are Doyle Proctor, down lineman 
and Barry Wheeler, linebacker. 

Patriots receiving honorable 
mention are Jeff Tiffin, guard; 
Dave Patrick, tackle; Kenneth 
Helms, linebacker; Larry Curry, 
safety, and Randy Woods, defen-
sive end. 

The Lubbock Avalanche-Journal 
also announced its All-South Plains 
selections and Patriots receiving 
honorable mention are Jeff Tif-
fin, guard; Rex Fuston, center; 
Ron Eudy, quarterback; Barry 
Wheeler and Darrell Dowd at 
running backs. 

The Valley Tribune extends 
congratulations to these boys for 
their achievements during the 
football season, and to Coaches 
Dill, Phelps and Dvorak for their 
work with the boys. 

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Lacy on Sunday were 
Mr. and Mrs. Jake Lacy of Groom, 
Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Gipson of 
Amarillo and Mrs. Reona Holcomb. 

Mrs. Joe David Payne and child-
ren of Plainview visited with her 
mother, Mrs. Goldie Russell, in 
Turkey this past weekend. 

imprinted on the cover. The hard 

cover edition was presented by 

Wayland's public relations direc-

tor, Al A. Morgan, who also serves 

as student publications sponsor. 

Owens, son of Mr. and Mrs. Gaston 

Owens of Quitaque, is now sports 

editor of the Plainview Reporter-

News. 

Local Woman's 

Brother Dies 
Leslie Carl Bruce died Sunday. 
Services were held at 2:30 p.m. 

Tuesday, December 7, in the First 
Baptist Church at Estelline with 
Rev. Finis Marchman, pastor, of-
ficiating. Burial was in the Hulver 
Cemetery by Spicer Funeral Home 
of Memphis. 

Mr. Bruce married Ola Melissa 
Bailey in 1928 at Quanah. She 
died in 1975. He was a retired 
farmer, and had lived in Hall 
County 65 years. 

Survivors include one son, Ted, 
of Estelline; four sisters, Mrs. Bill 
Vardeman and Mrs. Stella Depper-
man, both of Childress, Mrs. Ruff 
Jones of Pampa and Mrs. Carl 
Bowman of Turkey; three grand-
daughters, one grandson and one 
great-grandson. 

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Taylor for Thanksgiv-
ing were their daughter, Anna 
Jean, who was home from WTSU 
at Canyon, Mr. and Mrs. Phil 
Barefield and baby and Mrs. John 
Rogers. 

Mrs. Loetta Ferguson and Mrs. 
Annie Lois Hedrick were in Ver-
non on Tuesday of this week to 
attend an Income Tax School. 

Dinner guests in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Dowell Proctor Sun-
day were Mr. and Mrs. Dean Lane 
and Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Lane and 
family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bud Couch are 
moving to Plainview this week, 
where he will be attending Way-
land Baptist College. 

Progress Report 
Given By 
Fire Department 

Fire Chief David Brunson, Pres-
ident Jerry Maupin and Hose Cap-
tain Rex Harmon met with the 
City Council Monday night, De-
cember 6, to give the following 
progress report for the Quitaque 
Fire Department. 

The Quitaque Fire Department 
was re-organized in February 1976 
with 19 members. Since that time 
the membership has grown to a 
total of 27 members, with an av-
erage of 17 to 20 members present 
at each drill. Drills are held on 
the second and fourth Mondays of 
each month and last for two hours. 

During the ten months since 
the re-organization, the Depart-
ment has moved its drills to the 
old highway building which was 
given to them by the City. Since 
moving, there has been much re-
pair work done on the building. 
A new water line had to be run 
from the main line to the build-
ing, an air conditioner was in-
stalled, the toilets and lavatory 
were replumbed, the front was re-
paired and painted, seats were 
donated by the First Baptist 
Church, a Coke machine and cof-
fee put were added, and a base 
station CB is being installed to 
use in fire calls and during storm 
watches. 

An Army truck was secured 
through Panhandle Regional Plan-
ning Commission and is in the pro-
cess of being converted to an 
out-of-town and grass fire fight-
ing truck. The truck will also be 
of great help on fires in town. 

Repairs on the building and ma-
terials for the truck were paid 
for through the selling of old bat-
teries, CB posters and fire extin-
guishers. 

Also, during these ten months, 
nine members of the Department 
attended a fire fighting school in 
Canyon, and several are planning 
to attend the week-long school at 
Texas A&M this summer. There 
were also nine members who at- 
tended an Emergency Medical 
Techninian Course and are now 
certified EMT's. There are also 
several members interested in tak- 
ing the course in January. These 
extra EM'l"s will be very helpful 
since the Fire Department also 
operates the Ambulance Service. 

The Department is also check- 
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This is a "before" picture of the 

latest addition to the Quitaque 

Volunteer Fire Department. Af- 

ter renovation the Jeep will be 

used mainly for fighting fires in 

areas where there is no place to 

The "experts" were half right 
in their prediction as to what 
teams would win at Kress and 
this reporter was right when he 
warned that the Silverton Owl-
ettes might be a team to be reck-
oned with. 

Lubbock Christian High was 
picked to win the boys division at 
the Kress Tournament and they 
did just that. winning over Little-
field 60-50 in the Saturday night 
championship finals. 

However, the Nazareth Swift-
ettes, who were picked to win the 
girls championship, lost to Sil-
verton's Owlettes in a 56-55 over-
time thriller. 

Valley's Patriots took a third 
place trophy by nipping host Kress 
55-50 in the Saturday afternoon 
game. 

The Valley girls lost to Little-
field in the consolation finals, 
63-55. 

In first round action at Kress, 
Nazareth won over Valley 60-40 
in girls action. The Patriots bat-
tled the Swiftettes on even terms 
until the Valley guards got into 
foul trouble in the third period 
and had to ease off. The Swiftettes 
jumped into a 12-8 lead at the 
end of the first quarter but the 
Valley girls battled back to even 
it at 22 at halftime. Going into 
the fourth quarter Valley trailed 
by only six, 32-38, but after los-
ing two starting guards the Swift-
ettes pulled away for the win. 
Sherice Price sparked the Valley 
girls with 28 points. 

The Valley boys had better luck 
in the first round and won over 
Nazareth 41-28 with Kenny Chand-
ler hitting the basket for 17 
points. 

In second round action the Val-
ley girls won over Lubbock Chris-
tian 50-26 with Sherice Price a-
gain hitting for 22 points for Val-
ley. 

Lubbock Christian took a 15-
point, 61-46, win over the Valley 
boys. Kenny Chandler scored 16 
points in this one. 

In the girls consolation finals 
Saturday afternoon it was a close, 
physical game almost all of the 
way. The first quarter was shot 
for shot and was tied 10-10 at the 
end of the first quarter. Early in 

ing with some sources trying to 
locate funds to build a new fire 
house so that both trucks and the 
ambulance can be parked at one 
location. 

The City Council approved War-
ren Lee Merrell as Fire Marshall 
at the meeting. 

hook vp to pump with the "pum-

per"' truck. Members of the de-

partment bought the Jeep and 

paid for it themselves, even driv-

ing to El Paso to purchase the ve-

hicle and drive it to Quitaque. 

the second quarter Valley was 
whistled into penalty situation and 
that was the beginning of the end. 
Littlefield led 27-33 at halftime. 
Littlefield led by 14 points in the 
third period and was ahead 49-37 
at the end of three quarters. Val-
Icy put on a very stout finish but 
could not pull it out. The differ-
ence was very definitely in the 
free shooting, not that Littlefield 
had a better percentage of foul 
shooting. The Wildkittens made 
28 free shots and missed four. 
Valley shot nine and missed one. 
The Valley girls had 24 fouls cal-
led on them while Littlefield had 
13 called, according to this repor-
ter's bookkeeping. Valley scored 
23 field goals to 18 for the Wild-
kittens. Littlefield made only one 
field goal the last quarter and 12 
free shots. 

The Valley boys took the third 
place trophy by taking a 55-50 
win over Kress. Ron Eudy led all 
scorers with 26 points and Ron was 
the only Valley player, boys and 
girls, who was selected on the 
All-Tournament team. 

Tuesday night the varsity teams 
drove down to Matador and split 
a pair of games with the varsity 
teams. The Valley girls won 39-31 
to record their second win over 
Motley this season. Jena Mullin 
sparked the Patriots in this one, 
hitting for 17 points. This one was 
quite a game, going into overtime 
before the Patriots took charge. 
Valley led 8-6 at the end of the 
first quarter but trailed 14-15 at 
halftime. Valley led 20-17 at the 
end of three quarters but it was 
29-all at the end of regulation 
playing time. The Patriots took 
charge in overtime and scored 10 
points while allowing Motley only 
two points, 

The Valley boys trailed most of 
the way in their game and Motley 
got a bit of revenge for the loss 
to the Patriots in the Estelline 
Tournament earlier in the season. 
Ron Eudy popped the nets for 23 
points to lead all shooters. 

The Valley varsity teams are 
entered in the Tulia Tournament 
this weekend and both teams will 
play Slaton in their opening 
round games Thursday with the 
girls playing at 1:00 and the boys 
game scheduled at 2:30. 

Next Tuesday night the Valley 
teams will host the Motley teams 
in a four-game set-to with festivi-
ties due to start at 4 o'clock. 

The next scheduled games are 
December 21, when Estelline 
comes to Valley. 

Tulia Tournament 

Has Tough 
Lineup Of Teams 

The Tulia Tournament has a 
very tough lineup for teams com-
peting in that event. In the boys 
bracket teams are entered from 
Hedley, Vega, Dimmilt, Spur, Sla-
ton, Valley and Tulia. The girls 
lineup is the same except that the 
Canyon girls will replace Hedley. 
The winners of the Slaton-Valley 
games will play Tulia, the girls 
at 7:00 and the boys at 8:30 Fri-
day night. 

The losers of the Slaton-Valley 
game will draw a bye into the 
consolation finals (presumably) 
since Tulia's first round opponent 
(Cotton Center) withdrew, giving 
Tulia a first round bye. 

Curtis Tunnel attended the Tex-
as Justice of Peace training cen-
ter twenty hour seminar at the 
Hilton Inn in Amarillo. 

SPECIAL NOTICE! 
Your editors have let CHRIST-

MAS slip up on them again. WE 
HAVE NOT had time to get ar-
ound to all the businesses to get 
your Christmas Greetings to your 
patrons for the newspaper. If we 
have not contacted you and it is 
convenient for you to slop in The 
Tribune office when you go for 
coffee or at any time we are 
open, we will appreciate it. We 
will try to contact each of you, 
but if you would like to call us 
and have us bring the catalog to 
you at a certain time, we will be 
glad to accomodate you. Thanks. 

--o- - 

 Santa Letter 

Time Again! 
Once again, the Valley Tribune 

is asking the boys and girls to 
write their letters to Santa early 
so they may be included in the 
Christmas edition to be printed 
December 23. 

Letters addressed to Santa, c/o 
The Valley Tribune, Box 415, Quit-
aque, Texas 79255, will be copied 
and forwarded directly to the 
North Pole. This is done through 
a special arrangement with San-
ta, who likes for the yougnsters 
to write their letters early. 

Don H. Jacks Buried 
Last Thursday 

Don 11. Jacks, 64, died Tuesday, 
November 30, in the Municipal 
Hospital in Cushing, Oklahoma, 
following a lengthly illness. Mr. 
Jacks was born August 31, 1912, in 
New Market, Alabama. 

Funeral services were conducted 
by Davis Funeral Home with in-
terment in Cushing Memorial Ce-
metery Thursday, December 2, 
1976. 

Survivors include his wife, Thel-
ma, of the home; one daughter, 
Donice Monroe of Anadarko, Ok-
lahoma and two grandsons and 
three granddaughters; five sisters. 

Mr. Jacks was preceded in death 
by his parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. 
T. Jacks, long-time residents of 
Quitaque, two sisters and four 
brothers. 

Mr. Jacks was a member of the 
Baptist Church, having been con-
verted at an early age. 

He was the brother of Mrs. Ray-
mond Hamilton of Quitaque. 

Mrs. Anita Cavazos 
Buried At Quitaque 

Mrs. Anita (Lopez) Cavazos, 54, 
died Wednesday of last week in 
Lockney. 

Services were at 2:30 p.m. at 
Our Lady of Loreto Catholic 
Church in Silverton, with Father 
David Greka, pastor, officiating. 
Burial was in Rest Haven Ce-
metery by Quitaque Funeral 
Home. 

Mrs. Cavazos was a native of 
Texas and had lived in Quitaque 
and Briscoe County since 1957. 
She was married to Santos Cavazos 
in 1940 in Orange Grove. 

She was a member of Our Lady 
of Loreto Catholic Church. 

Survivors include the widower; 
three daughters, Mrs. Flavia Or-
tiz, Miss Sylvia Cavazos and Mrs. 
Amala Ortiz, all of Quitaque; four 
sons, Emilio, Gustaze and Nestor, 
all of Lubbock and Joe of Amar-
illo; five sisters, Mrs. Gregoria 
Garza and Mrs. Olizira Alaniz, 
both of Orange Grove, Mrs. Clara 
Canales of Big Spring, Mrs. Celia 
Villorrial of Alvarado, and Mrs. 
Baula Salomon of Martha, Okla-
homa; six brothers, Cruz Lopez, 
jr. and Desidoro Lopez, both of 
Alice, Talo Lopez of Orange Grove, 
Guadalupe Lopez of Arlington, 
Macareil Lopez of Corpus Christi 
and Filiberto Lopez of Baytown; 
and 14 grandchildren. 

Mission Emphasis 
Night Planned 

The Quitaque First Baptist 
Church has scheduled 7:30 p.m. 
on December 14 as Mission Em-
phasis Night. The Missionary in 
Residence at Wayland Baptist Col-
lege, Rev. and Mrs. C. R. (Buck) 
Smith, will be the featured Mis-
sionaries. 

In the past year, the Rev. Smith 
has worked with the camp minis-
tries and several pastors of the 
mission in San Felipe, Venezuela. 
Mrs. Smith leas worked with the 
Medical Dispensary in the First 
Baptist Church in Valencia, Vene-
zuela. 

The Mission in San Felipe re-
cently became the First Baptist 
Church of San Felipe. It is the 
first Baptist church in a town of 
80,000 and the first Baptist church 
in the state of Yaracuy, popula-
tion over 300,000. 

An invitation Is open to the en-
tire community to attend this spe-
cial program. A reception for the 
Rev. and Mrs. Smith will be held 
following the service. 

Valley FFA Chapter 
Attends Banquet 

The Valley FFA Chapter was 
represented at the Greenbelt Dis-
trict Banquet in Wellington Mon-
day night by twenty-six members 
and guests. 

Miss Sherice Price, daughter of 
Mi. and Mrs. Hubert Price of 
Turkey, was named second run-
nerup in the District Sweetheart 
Contest. The local chapter is very 
proud of Sherice and the fine 
manner in which she represented 
us in the contest. Jena Mullin ac-
companied her to the banquet. 

The Valley Chapter received six 
leadership banners for winnings 
in this year's contests. This makes 
three consecutive years for us to 
be the only school in the District 
to win a banner in all six contests. 

Voting delegates for Valley 
were Don Douglas and Gary Clin-
ton. Our Area Officer from the 
Greenbelt District is Pepper Jones 
from the Valley Chapter. Pepper 
gave a very interesting talk at the 
banquet. Rex Fusion is our Dis-
trict Officer from the Valley Chap-
ter. Other members attending 
were Wes Reed, Jessie Castillo, B. 
G. Pierce, Jimmy Don Davidson, 
Larry Curry, Jesse Ferguson, Ran-
dy Woods, Greg Ramsey, Kirk 
Proctor, Kenneth Helms, Lex Her-
rington, Scott Leeper, Angel Cas-
tillo, Lyndal Couch, Dennis Far-
ley, Dave Patrick, Vance Price, 
Delores and Hubert Price and 
Jay Eudy. 

Kenny Setliff Is 
Member Of Delta XI 
Chapter At WTSU 

Kenny Setliff, a junior at West 
Texas State University from Tur-
key, has been initiated into the 
Delta XI chapter of Beta Beta 
Beta, the national honor society 
in biology. 

Kenny, a biology major, is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Arville Setliff 
of Turkey. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Barbee were 
called to Odessa for the back sur-
gery of their son-in-law, Dave Cox, 
Friday. They returned home Sun-
day evening reporting Dave came 
through the surgery in fine con-
dition. He is the husband of the 
former Pat Barbee. 

The Fire Department responded 
to a call at the C. T. Rucker farm 
recently where an implement shed 
and two tractors were destroyed. 
No one knows how the fire start-
ed and it was a complete loss, ac-
cording to reports. 

Danny Mayfield accompanied 
Jack Chandler to Fort Worth one 
night last week and spent the 
night with his mother, Mrs. Jerry 
Price and family. 



Free Estimates Lowest Prices 

Phone 293-4358 
Night 296-2134 
Call Collect 

726 Broadway 
Plainview, Texas 79072 

Autolite Spark Plugs 

Rockwell Circular Saw 

at 50c each 

$24.95 

ALADDIN CARPET 
SAM JACKSON 

KAREN'S HAIRSTYLING 
OPEN TUESDAY, THROUGH SATURDAY — OPEN AT 8 A.M. 

Call 455-1489 for Appointment 

CHRISTMAS SPECIALS 
QUASAR COLOR TELEVISIONS 

We will give a 5% discount on all 
Televisions we have in stock until 

December 24, 1976. 
These sets are Solid State, and 77 Models 
Prices range from 	$455.00 to $683.25 

We have Dow Guard Anti-Freeze at 
$3.88 per gal. 

AM-FM Radios with CB Receiver $24.95 

LOWE HDW. & AUTO PARTS 
Box 416 

Quitaque, Texas 79255 

This phone manufactured by American Telecommunications Corporauon. 

Touch Caning or dial models available to match service In your area. 

$150" 
In Cash 8 Merchancrise Plus Rebate .. 

Let Boot Hill Foot Your Christmas Bill 

Open Every Night Til 10 p.m. 

Hundreds Of Gift Ideas 
Free Gift Wrapping 

Boot Hill Western Store 
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Mrs. Herrington 
Presents Students 
In Recital 

Mrs. Patsy Herrington will pre-
sent her piano students in recital 
Wednesday, December 15, at 7:00 
p.m. in the auditorium of the First 
Baptist Church in Quitaque. A 
program of all Christmas music 
will be presented. 

Those participating are Joe Mor- 

* NEW BABY 
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Martinez 

are the proud parents of a baby 
boy, Rene Martinez, born Novem-
ber 21, 1976 at Lockney Hospital. 
He weighed 7 lbs. 12 1/2 ozs. He is 
20% inches long. He has two sis-
ters, Melinda and Delrna. 

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Cirlido Leal and Mr. and Mrs. San-
tiago Martinez, all of Quitaque. 

Guests in the Joe Tiffin home 
for Thanksgiving were their chil-
dren, Mr. and Mrs. Durwood Wil-
kinson and children from Haskell, 
Mr. and Mrs. Danny Tiffin and 
children, Childress and Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Tiffin, Silverton. J. 
B. Tiffin and Lynn Cox also had 
dinner with them. 
viewwitiewvermweerieeviii 

SUNDAY, DECEMBER 12, 1976 
Morning Service 	11:00 a.m. 

"YOU ARE RICH" 
Revelation 2:8-11 

Evening Service 	6:30 p.m. 
"THE BLIND SEE" 

Luke 18:35-43 
Sunday School 	10:00 a.m. 
Church Training 	5'30 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Second and Morris Streets 

Quitaque, Texas 
Frank Roberson, Pastor 

rison, Jeff Fuston, Lisa Herring- 
ton, Cari, Criss and Colvin Mor- 
rison, Karen and Dana Ramsey, 

Robin Myers, Candy Jones, Lori 
Clay, Billy Robinson, DeAnna and 
DeVonna Smith, Melissa Maupin, 

Stachia Chadwick, Terri and Patti 
Ramsey, Melody Cruse, Rhonda 
Leeper, Kaylene Green, Jill Eudy, 

Linda Coker, Sandi Lipscomb, An-
gela Eudy, Cindy Griffin, Donna 
Brown, Bena Patrick, Iva June 
Johnson, Eva Gail Reagan, Elaine 
Adams, Joanie Turner and Judy 
Morrison. 

There will be a reception fol- 

lowing the program. 
The public is invited. 
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THE 

FAMILY BANK 

EVERY MEMBER OF THE 

FAMILY WILL FEEL COMFORTABLE 

BANKING WITH THE  

Peoples 
A4  State Bank 
FDIC 
	

Phone 423-1321 

Give the world's most lovable phone 
this Christmas! 

Now Mickey Mouse stars in a fabu-
lous new role: a real, real phone. Pure 
Disney from his tweaky nose to his 
squeaky toes. Each one is individually 
numbered—a collector's item everyone 
can own. Hurry and order the worICs 
most lovable gift now. We don't have all 

GEllERAL TELEPHOIlE 

FARM FRESH PRODUCE 

sorANGES 4 lbs. 1" LETTUCE 	lb. 	250 
690  

	 100 

LIPSCOMB QUALITY FOODS 
GUNN BROS. STAMPS 	 DOUBLE ON WEDNESDAY 

Turkey, Texas 

that many. Call our business office for 
all details. 

THE MICKEY MOUSE PHONE 
The Mickey Mouse housing is owned by bn y.s 9, 

you, but the working parts remain ours UM - 
—so if there's a problem, we'll fie II.) 

Opitonel payment plant avalle010. 
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Merry Christmas, 
A Merle Norman Gift 

Says It Beautifully 

Arabesque 
Gift Set 

Shurfine Early Size 3 - 303 Can 

JUNE PEAS 	54c 

kaftAlZWAIDAIS 	37c 

6 Pack 32 oz. Plus Deposit 

Coke or Dr. Pepper _ _ _ $1.59 

Merrell Food 

For Your Flower and Variety Needs 
SHOP AT 

FARLEYS FLOWERS & VARIETY 
PHONE 455-1410 	 QUITAQUE, TEXAS 

Young's Auto 
Supply 

Phone 423-1111 	Turkey, Texas 
.....".40"ftio".0"••••• ■■•■■ 

COMPLETE AUTOMOTIVE 
REPAIRS and PARTS 

We Also Feature Gulf Produds 
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JIMMIE'S FLOWERS AND GIFTS 
POT PLANTS AND ARTIFICIAL ARRANGEMENTS 

Complete Wire Service 

Phone 423-1323 	 Turkey, Texas 79261 

LOLLA BELLE'S BEAUTY SHOPPE 
Phone 455-1305 

OPEN WEDNESDAY THROUGH SATURDAY 
OPERATORS, LOLLA BELLE, BARBARA SAUL, 

AND ELAINE HARMON 

Dr. 0. R. McIntosh 
OPTOMETRIST 

316 Fouth Main Phone 983-3460 
Floydada, Texas 

Mr. and Mrs. Stan Simmons of 
Sweetwater spent the Thanksgiv-
ing holidays with her parents and 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Grady L. 
Tyler and Larry. Lisa Blair, who 
is making her home with the Ty-
lers, flew to Houston to spend the 
holidays with her parents. 

Mrs. Thelma Truelock spent 
Thanksgiving with her daughter 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Dave 
Wilson in Clarendon. Her sister, 
Mrs. Lenora Young of Burlington, 
Colorado, who is here visiting Mrs. 
Truelock, drove to Cheyenne, Ok-
lahoma to visit a son and family, 
the Ray Youngs. They all drove 
to Burlington to visit the rest of 
the family. They decided they had 
better return to Oklahoma before 
they were snowed in and they re-
turned home that night. They 
have received word since that it 
snowed five inches that night, 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 

The City of Turkey will hold a 
public hearing at 7:00 p.m. De-
cember 9, 1976 at City Hall in 
Turkey in regard to the possible 
submission of an application to the 
Department of Housing and Urban 
Developments for a Community 
Development Block Grant to par-
tially finance improvements to the 
Community. 

The purpose of the meeting is 
to provide citizens with adequate 
information concerning the am-
ount of funds available ($50,000 
to $250,000) for proposed commun-
ity development and housing acti-
vities including Land Acquisition, 
Rehabilitation of Public Facilities, 
Citizen Centers, Streets and Drain-
age Improvements, Sewer Mains, 
Parks-Playground, Code Enforce-
ment, Clearance and Demolition, 
Public Services and other work. 
This meeting is to provide citizens 
an adequate opportunity to parti-
cipate in the development of the 
application. The Housing Assis-
tance Plan shall be discussed as 
it pertains to this area. 

Another public hearing on the 
same subject and for the same 
purpose will be held at 7:00 p.m. 
December 16, 1976 at City Hall, 
Turkey, Texas. 

Signed: 
Jay L. Eudy, Mayor 

25-2c 

causing highline trouble, and no 
heat in an all-electric home. They 
feel they were lucky that they 
left when they did. 

Mrs. Young returned to Claren-
don and she and Mrs. Truelock re-
turned to Quitaque on Monday 
following Thanksgiving. 
	 0 	  

The James Taylors spent from 
Tuesday until Friday of last week 
visiting their son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie Taylor and family in Am-
arillo, and another son and fam-
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Dewayne Martin 
and family in Canyon. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. C. Moss of An-
son recently brought her mother, 
Mrs. J. T. Bradley, home after 
Mrs. Bradley had spent a few days 
in the hospital there and several 
days in the home of her daughter. 

THE COUNTRY STORE 

Tony Lama Boots — Good Selection 	  

TURQUOISE JEWELRY 
Men make that lady a syes.ial gift of Quality Turquoise Indian Jewelry — Zuni, Navajo, 
Hopi and Santa Domingo — Signed Pieces 	  20-30% OFF 

TIRES 
Michelin Tires — 225-15 — Regular 94.33 	  Now $77.88 
Dayton Deluxe Poly — G-78-14 — Regular 39.95 	  Now $33.97 

Sale On All Other Tires — Plenty Of Used Tires 

PICKUP ACCESSORIES 
Suntighter Headache Rack — Regular 66.00 	  Now $57.97 
Grill Guards — For Small Pickup — Regular 51.95 	  Now 43.88 
Grill Guards — For Regular Pickup — Regular 54.95 	  Now 54.95 
Tool Boxes — Regular 99.00 	  Now $79.88 

C. B. RADIOS 
Large Stock to Choose From — We Service What We Sell By A F. C. C. Licensed 
Technician — 10% Off On All Accessories — Sale On All Radios — Too Many To List 
BROWNING BROWNIE — Regular 149.95 	  Now $69.95 
PACE 143 — Regular 139.95 	  Now $59.95  
COBRA 21 — Regular 169.00 	  Now $129.00 
COBRA 29 — Regular 209.00 	  Now $159.00 
SBE Console II Sideband Base — Regular 454.00 	  Now $369.95 
SBE Formula D — Regular 229.95 	  Now $189.95 
BROWNING SST — Regular 189.95 	  Now $159.95 
BEARFINDER Radar Detector — Regular 119.95 	  Now $89.95 

SALE LASTS THROUGH DECEMBER 24, 1976 — ALL SALES CASH — 

BANK AMERICARD AND MASTER CHARGE ACCEPTED 

OF QUITAQUE 

says 
"MERRY CHRISTMAS" 

with a PRE-CHRISTMAS-SALE! 
BOOTS 

15-20% OFF Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Smith 
were hosts for a family dinner on 
Thanksgiving. Those present were 
Mrs. Nena Loudermilk of Silver-
ton, Mr. and Mrs. Micky Smith, 
Turkey, Miss Shonda Smith of 
Texas A&M, who was home for 
the holidays, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Dale Smith and children. 

Mrs. Ralph Carter and Mrs. 
Shorty Woods spent Tuesday night 
of this week in Lubbock. 

It is reported Mrs. Bradley is 
slowly improving in health. 

for your 

CHRISTMAS PARTIES 

CHECK AT THE BANK FOR RESERVATIONS 

FIRST 
NATIONAL 

-BANK 
PHONE 455-1441 	 QUITAQUE, TEXAS 

Roye's of Quitaque 

BIG "T" RESTAURANT 

THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK 

COMMUNITY ROOM 

is available 

A REMINDER!!! 

One Step 

Ear Piercing 
• 24K 

acrtee 

Erjc y the b rnu ty 

pier( ,e,(.! en Frirq5" 

Rove's of Ouitaque 

Friday & Saturday Specials 	SPECIALS FOR DEC. 10 - 11 

9 

9 

9 

9 

SHURFRESH MILK 
'/2 Gallon 	89c 
1 Gallon 	 $176 

CUCUMBERS 	33c 
Tendercrust 1% Lb. Loaf 

BREAD 	45c 

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING 
GRAIN FED 

BEEF & PORK 
Please have cattle in by 11 am 
Thurs. Only Phone 455-1282 

Pillsbury Country Style 

BISCUITS 	7is1" 
Jumbo Size All 9 lb. 13 oz. Laundry 

DETERGENT • • • 2 • 

$319 

Hunts Stewed or Whole 

TOMATOES .... 
Oscar Mayer 12 oz. Package 

BOLOGNA 	89' 
Kraft Deluxe Macaroni and Cheese 

DINNER 	65c 

6141ER NAPKINS .35c • 
Shertresb 

TIMM OW 

Towle( Cris, 

WE WILL BE CLOSED 

Chrldmas Eve, Christmas Day 

and on Sunday after Christmas 

DOUBLE BUCCANEER STAMPS WED. ON ALL PURCHASES 



For Sale: 1974 Chevrolet Pickup, 
Cheyenne Super, extra clean, cus-

tom paint. See Dale Ramsey, Quit-
ague, or call 455-1278. 26-3tp 

Garage Sale: Friday and Satur-
day, December 10-11, located a-

cross the street from the City 
Park in Quitaque. Items for sale 
are a washer, beds, chairs and 

clothing. Myra Brown. 

Representatives for 
ALL TYPES OF 

MONUMENTS , 
AND 

CURBING 

Seigler Funeral 
Home 

423-1313 - Turkey, Texas 

DECORATED CAKES 

BIRTHDAY, WEDDING AND 

SPECIAL OCCASION 

CONTACT BETH TURNER 

Ph. 455-1437, Quitaque 

I will take trading stamps 
in payment 

18-4tc 

ATTEND CHURCH OF 

YOUR CHOICE SUNDAY. 

REX - DOROTHY JOHNSON 

We Have Trailers Tires, Hubs & Wheels 

CAPROCK 
GIN 
CO 

Your Independent Insurance Agent 

HELP WHEN YOU 
NEED IT MOST 

We're independent insurance agents. 

That means we'll be ready to help you 

when things go wrong. Ready to give you 

service beyond the call of duty. Call us 

today. 

Stark Insurance Agency 
PHONE 455-1100 
	

QUITAQUE, TEXAS 

WE HAVE 
Bradley Dolls, Blow Dryers, Mr. Coffee, 

Musical Jewelery Boxes, 
Old Fashioned Horse Shoe Game, 

Kitchen Gadgets, Wall Clocks, 
Coty Fragrances, Norelco Razors, 

Timex Watches, Cameras, 
Pangburn Chocolates, Pocket Watches, 

Schrade Old-Time Knives 

Many other useful gifts for your friends 
and family. 

CITY DRUG 
Turkey, Texas 	Phone 423-1126 

ove 5 

IS GIVING 
A SPECIAL CHRISTMAS GIFT 

WITH EACH $10.00 PURCHASE, 
excluding drug and fountain items 

you may register for a 

GRANDFATHER CLOCK 
to be given away December 14 
For details, inquire at Roye's 

Quitaque, Texas 
I  54F  

"WE %MOW WHAT YOU ME AIN WHEN YOU'RE TALNING PARTS' 

1.1U ✓TIN 	 FOOLLriq'0110 
FAST RUSH 	QUARITZ-KIALOGER 

RAND SP'OTLIGHT 

01, 

,u011 10 

 r100 

"St39 	'S19.99 oo 
II 	

I„',, 	$2.79 

SHOCK 
1!r1  • 	ASSORREAS 

\:\* 

SPIti 	t.MAMIFIS 

a 

'''`..`:.”1 "." 527.95 	"S8.99 	I 	I:4141.1 99c "'$15.95 rItrIMITINTOWEL7777"rr"171737==========  
1114044ROFF 	DUPLE-COLCIR 	RORIARLE 	BLUE STREAK 

CAR RAMPS 	POINT SE T'S 

$2.09 

77-7-rrirr,..77a 

3r1.1 and Main ,,, p• 	I'Llq , 1:. 3321, 
Turkey, Texas. 79261 

Turkey Automotive Supply 

11M171.171 e 

DISCOUNT PRICES 
on CB RADIOS 

for CHRISTMAS 
Cobra 19 - 23 ch. A M Mobile Reg. 129.95 - $18.88 
Cobra 21 - 23 ch. A. M. Mobile Reg. 179.95 128.88 
Cobra 28 - 23 ch. A. M. Mobile Reg. 219.95 $158.88 
Cobra 85 - 23 ch. A. M. Mobile - Base 189.95 $98.88 
Cobra 138 - SSB-A.M. Mobile Reg. 339.95 $248,88 

BOB'S CITY GROCERY 
SPECIALS FOR DEC. 10 - 11 

Sliced - D - Rind 
SLAB BACON 

98( 

9' 4  oz. Shurfine 
Cinnamon Rolls 

49c 

31 oz. Coke, 
Dr, Pepper, 7-Up 

6 pack _ $1.59 

32 oz. Shurfine Dill 
Pickle Slices 

69c 

2 lb. Testa 
Saltine Crackers 

99c  
17 oz. Dow 

Bathroom (leaner 
98c 

11 oz. Del Monte 
Fruit Cocktail 

45c 

50 d, Gala 
Dinner Napkins 

48c 
1/2 Gal. Bordens 

Ice (ream 
$1.29 

10 oz. Kraft Mini. 
Marshmallows 

39( 

Shurfresh Milk 
' 12 Gallon 	89c 
Gallon 	$1,76 

11/2 lb. Loaf 
Tendercrust Bread 

45( 

CARD OF THANKS 
I would like to say "thank you" 

for every act of kindness shown 
to my family and me during my 
recent illness. The prayers were 
most appreciated, but the flowers, 
gifts, cards and phone calls cheer-
ed me greatly. I want to especial-
ly thank Bro. Elgin and James and 
Ruth Brunson for driving to Lub-
bock to be with my family during 
my surgery. Thanks again. 

Robin Myers 

Robyn WV-23 23 ch. A.M. Mobile Reg. 129.95 - $59.95 
Midland 13-853 23 ch. A. M. Mobile 144.95 - $69.95 
Midland 13-892 SSB - A. M. Mobile 299.95 - $169.95 

BOB'S CITY GROCERY 
Quitaque 	 Phone 455-1220 

5r31180. 	
I, ir  

M/, RENT4.0 

For Sale: 80 acres of Mrs. Joe 
Woodruff land, located four miles 
east and one-half mile north of 

Quitaque. Possession on closing. 
One-half minerals Non Par. Con- 
tact Ayleen Hicks, Guardian, 3711 

47th, Lubbock, Texas 79413. Ph. 
799-4486 or 799-5522, or see Mrs. 

Leroy Hamilton, Quitaque, Texas. 

26.4tc 

Retired lady to live in with elder-
ly lady. Write or call Donald K 

Holt, 2618 33rd St., Lubbock, Tex-
as 79410. Ph. 795-4127. 26-2tc 

For Sale: 1 lamp, $15.00; 1 cabin-
et model Singer sewing machine, 

$30.00; 1 half size bed like new, 

box springs and mattress, spread 
included, $100.00; 1 pair end tab-

les, $25.00. Call 423-1346. 26.1tr 

For Sale: 120 acres farmland near 

Quitaque. New terraces. 	Posses- 
sion January 1, 1977. 	26-tfc 

Garage Sale: In building west of 

Lipscomb Grocery, last day on 

Saturday, 8:30 a.m. to 5 p.m. 26-1c 

TREFLAN, less than $113.00. Pro- 

ducers Cooperative Elevator, Floy- 
dada. 806-983-2821. 	 21-tfc 

BEEF 
Choice Cut and Wrapped 

For Your Freezer 

75c lb. 

You Cannot Buy Better Beef 
at any price! 
Good 69c lb. 

LOCKNEY MEAT COMPANY 

Phone 652 -3305 
Sam Fortenberry, Mgr. 

21 -tfc 

For Sale: 1967 Trailer House (Tim. 

co) 60 ft. x 12 ft., with utility 
room extra, 2 bedroom, central 

heating, furnished, good condition. 

Priced $5,000.00. Ph. 455.1396, 
Bobo Morrison, Quitaque. 23-tfc 

For Sale: Tractor Cab for 4010 
John Deere; cheap. Call 423.1220. 

25-2tc 

GERMANIA Farm Mutual Aid As. 
sociation: reasonable, sound pro- 
perty insurance. If you want to 

save, contact Mrs. Orville Lee, 

F I omot. 806469-5370. 41-8tp 

THANK YOU 

I would like to express my deep 
appreciation to everyone who vis-
ited me and sent flowers, cards 
and gifts during my stay in the 
hospital. 

I would also like to express a 
special thanks to the many won-
derful people who have helped 
me harvest my crops. May God 
richly bless each and everyone of 
you. 

Eugene Ferguson 

CARD OF THANKS 
We want to thank everyone 

who helped put out the fire at 
our farm recently. Thanks, espe-
cially, to the Fire Department and 
everyone who answered the call. 
We appreciate all of you who 
showed concern in any way. 

Mrs. C. T. Rucker and C. T., jr. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to thank all our friends 

and relatives for your kindness, 
the food, flowers and your pray-
ers. Thank you. 

Santos Cavazos and family 

Mr. and Mrs. James Taylor 
spent Thanksgiving Day with their 
daughter and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
M. H. McCaghren, at Petersburg. 

Mrs. Ralph Carter spent from 
Wednesday until Friday visiting 
her daughter, Mrs. Larry Hedrick 
and boys in Hereford. Larry was 
out-of-town on business. 

IRRIGATION PIPE 

UNDERGROUND 

Asbestos • Cement for main lino 

sprinkler pipe. All sizes plastic 
pipe for water and gas. Rhoda 

Pipe Co., Phone 823-2458. Res. No., 

823-2149, Silverton, Texas. 17-tfc 

CLOSE OUT 
on 

LOOSE LEAF NOTEBOOKS 
Bargains 

$1.00 each 
VALLEY TRIBUNE 

at Quitaque 

CAROLYN'S PASTRIES 

Wedding and Birthday Cakes 
()the': Pastries 

-Order in Advance- 
CAROLYN KITCHENS 

Silverton, Texas 

SINGER SEWING MACHINES, Va. 
cuum Cleaners, Smith Corona 

Typewriters and Adding Machines. 

Buy here, service here. Call 3131 

In Quitaque, 3541 In Turkey, or 
259-2716 In Memphis. Office local, 

 ed at 719 Main, Memphis. Here 

every two weeks on Thursdays. 

Piano Tuning: Edward C. Lain, 
24 years experience. Write Box 

425, Silverton, or call 823-2151, 

823-2052, or contact the Valley 

Tribune office, 455-1101 in Quita. 

que. 13-tfc 

For Sale: Alfalfa Hay in Bales. 

See Gerald Carnes or Bill Carnes 
at Turkey. 	 23-4tp 

For Sale: 1967 Chevrolet Impala, 

4-door, power steering and brakes, 
tilted steering wheel, radial tires. 

James Barefield. 25.2tp 

For Sale: Kitchen table, goon' con- 

dition, without chairs. Ph. 455- 

1167, or see at Bud Bailey home. 

25-21c 

NEW FURNITURE: We have in 

stock 3 queen size hide-a-beds and 

two regular divans. Also, several 
recliners, including 3 La-Z-Boys; 

one set of tables, hexagon, square 
and coffee; several platform and 

swivel rockers. Theda and Homer 

T. Jenkins, Ph. 347-2224, Matador, 

Texas 79244. 25-41c 

FIRE EXTINGUISHERS For Sale: 
By the Quitaque Fire Department, 
price $9.50 each. May save your 

home from fire until the depart. 
ment can get there. See any fire-

man. 25-tfc 

FOR YOUR NEW HOME and all 
your building needs, residential or 

commercial, call E. S. Rice and 

Son, Builders, 609 Arthur, Tulia, 

phone 995-2750. 25.4tp 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
sell under sealed bid, December 

The City of Turkey, Texas will 
17th, 1976, at 10:00 a.m. at the 
Turkey City Hall. Turkey, Texas, 
the following described property 
to wit: 

All of Lot 5, Block 1, Mea-
cham Addition of Turkey, Hall 
County, Texas. 
All of Lot 16, Block 12, JAB 
Addition of Turkey, Hall 
County, Texas. 
Bids must be a minimum of the 

court costs. 
The City of Turkey reserves the 

right to reject any and all bids. 
Signed: 
Jay L. Eudy 
Mayor, City of Turkey 

24-3c 

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 9, 1976 	THE VALLEY TRIBUNE 

COURTEOUS SERVICE 
PHONE 455-1361 

OZEAN'S MOBIL SERVICE 
Quitaque, Texas 

1 
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