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New Year’s 
Closings Announced

‘Puppy
Dog

Tails”
By VANDA KING 

Editor

After being introduced to Blandye’s 
boyfriend’s new puppy, a four-week- 
old Rottweiler Sunday, lots of tales 
about puppies came back to mind. 
Chap is an absolute darling, who stole 
our hearts at first glance. We felt like 
it best to make friends with him now, 
before he grows into a giant. Already 
he bites on your hand and growls with 
intensity if you give much struggle.

Once we were overly blessed with 
two female dogs expecting pups. Shel­
ly, a cow dog, lost her puppies, and 
when Sugar, a bird dog, had her 10 to 
12 litter, Shelly thought they were 
hers.

All day the dogs spent their time 
moving the pups from one nlace to 
another. Sugar had them in the bam 
and Shelly would transfer them to the 
playhouse.

Then one day they tired with the 
idea and had a terrible fight on the 
front porch. Both were basically white 
dogs, and when the battle halted, after 
I threw water on them, they were red 
with blood.

They seemed to have solved their 
differences after that, but Shelly still 
kept one little black puppy with her a 
lot. He was Blandye’s pick of the lit­
ter, Spunky. Naturally, he was the one 
who fell to the bottom of the haystack 
and had to be retrieved, too.

This dog had the patience of Jobe 
and could keep up with a vehicle at 35 
miles per hour. He got his leg nearly 
severed in an animal trap and survived 
many years before disappearing.

One Christmas a little Cockapoodle 
belonging to my parents had her first 
litter of puppies on a bitter cold day. 
Daddy and Leah were delivering the 
little ones, and Daddy was making 
them bobtailed at the same time. Tillie 
was one of these sweeties; a waddling 
ball of white, kinky hair, with no eyes 
showing.

She was my very favorite. She could 
distinguish exactly what toy you asked 
her to fetch. She carried a pink puppy 
pacifier around with her most of the 
time, and she could find it anywhere. 
When she was tiny she would fetch a 
friz bee and little football.

Kye would tell her to run like an 
18-wheeler and she would run as fast 
as she could round and round the 
house. We were all so attached, pro­
bably because we had to take turns at 
night caring for her.

Another family in town had one of 
the litter mates, and I came home for 
lunch one day and I thought I was see­
ing double, for there were two puppies 
playing the yard. Someone had 
mistakenly thought they returned 
Tillie.

You have heard of a one man dog. 
Well, Tootie was a one girl puppy, 
preferring Blandye to everyone. In 
case, I was afraid of the little rascal 
because she was so growlly. There 
was one thing she was good for, 
however. Blandye had a couple of 
show lambs that would not lead, but 
Tootie could get their halter leads and 
they would follow her anywhere. Kye 
was about two years old and he would 
shout “ Rise and shine!”  The little dog 
would have the sheep going fine.

She was bitten by a copperhead and 
I couldn’t get her out from under the 
bed to take her to the vet. Blandye 
wasn’t at home and she wasn’t about 
to let anyone else touch her. A 
neighbor recovered her and placed her 
in a rabbit cage so we could take her to 
Cisco. She survived the bite, but the
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The Cross Plains Frozen Food 
Locker will be closed both Tuesday, 
December 31, and Wednesday, 
January 1. Tim’s Floral and Gifts, 
E l le n ’s C lo se t and H ughes 
Upholstery, Pioneer Farmer Co-Op, 
and Mediplex will close at noon on 
Tuesday through Wednesday. Cross 
Plains Medical Center will close at 
12:30 Tuesday through Wednesday.

Local businesses closed Wednes­
day, New Year’s Day, will be Higgin­
botham’s, Ray’s Barber Shop, Dal- 
Mar Energy, Inc., Greenwood In­
surance, Cross Plains City Hall, 
Citizens State Bank, U.S. Post Office,

Cross Plains Auto Supply. Bryan’s 
Variety, Johnson’s Dry Goods, Neal 
Drug, Western Auto, The Back 
Room, The Movie Store, Johnston 
Truck, Skeet Walker Trailer Sales. 
West Texas Utilities, Lawrence Farm 
and Ranch Supply, Car Registration 
Office, Cross Plains Grain and Peanut 
Company, Cross Plains Petroleum. 
Senior Citizens Center, Car Registra­
tion Office, and the Cross Plains 
Review.

Village Market, Lakeway Grocery, 
Food Plaza, and Skinny’s will remain 
open during the holiday.

HO! HO! HO! — Santa Claus is pic- About...” Program children, 
tured with pre-school “ Learn

The Claus Family 
Visited Library

By BILLIE LOVING

Not only Santa Claus (Alton Mc- 
Cowen), but also Mrs. Santa (Betty 
Lewis) visited the “ Learn About...” 
Program at the Cross Plains Public 
Library last Wednesday. Santa toted a 
huge sack brim-full of sacks, one for 
each child.

As the children were singing 
“ Jingle Bells,” they heard the ringing 
of bells, and in came Mr. and Mrs. 
Santa with a big “ Ho! Ho! Ho!”

To prove to Santa that they had been 
“ learning about”  things, the children 
said the Pledge of Allegiance. Every

mouth mnvpH since Santa was wat- 
ching. The behavior was unparalleled 
as Santa called nair.ee end Mrs. Santa 
delivered the sacks to each child. San­
ta asked the children not to open the 
sacks until they left the library so that 
they would not lose anything, and, for 
the first time ever, not one sack was 
opened!

After Santa left, all had Christmas 
tree cookies, provided each year by 
Connie Kirkham.

The sacks were contributed by the 
Village Market. Goodies were provid­
ed by the library and Yvonne Peevy. 
The party was great.

Holiday 
Deadlines For 
Cross Plains 

Review
Articles must be turned in­

to the Cross Plains Review 
by Friday. Classified and 
display ads deadline is Mon­
day at noon.

Your cooperation is greatly 
appreciated by the 
newspaper staff.

Homer Robison 
Scholarship Established

By JACK SCOTT

An award of SI.000 annually to a 
Texas high school graduate was 
recently created by Dallas Digital Cor­
poration to honor the memory of the 
late Homer Robison w ho was reared in 
Cross Plains.

Robison, who served as general 
manager, of the huge corporation, was

BRO. DURWARD WEATHERFORD

New Minister At 
Church Of Christ
Durward Weatherford assumed the 

duties of the local evangelist of the 
Cross Plains Church of Christ that 
meets at the comer of 12th and Main. 
He and his wife, Joyce, moved into the 
preacher’s home Tuesday, December 
3, 1991. The Weatherfords have two 
grown children. Their son, Larry, his 
wife and two children lived in Ibaraki, 
Japan where Larry teaches in the 
Ibaraki Christian College. Their 
daughter, Regina, her husband and 
two children live in Woodward, 
Oklahoma where he is Market

Manager for United Super Markets.
The Weatherfords moved here from 

Wellington, Texas where Durward 
was the evangelist for the Bowie Street 
Church of Christ. He had previously 
preached for congregations at Warren, 
Roosevelt, Duke, and Mountain View, 
all in Oklahoma. He is in his 32nd 
year of the ministry.

The Weatherfords express their 
deep appreciation for the warm recep­
tion received since moving to Cross 
Plains and look forward to getting bet­
ter acquainted with everyone.

Girls Scout Cookie Sale To Begin January 10
Cross Plains Girl Scouts, in the 

Heart of Texas Girl Scout Council, 
will kick-off the annual Girl Scout 
cookie sale on January 10. The girls * 
will be taking orders through January 
27; then cookies will be delivered to 
customers from February 14 through 
February 25. Payment for cookies will 
not be accepted until cookies are 
delivered. There are seven delicious 
varieties including: Old-fashioned
shortbread Trefoils, crunchy peanut 
butter Do-Si-Dos, chocolatey Thin 
Mints, deliciously different Samoas, 
peanut butter Tagalongs, Chalet 
Creames — vanilla and lemon cream 
sandwich cookies, and new this year 
Golden Nut Clusters — chew caramel 
and pecans covered with a light maple 
coating.

There are currently more than 38 
girts in 3 troops in Cross Plains who 
are benefitting from the Girl Scout 
program. Volunteer leadership for the 
girls is provided by more than 19 
adults in our community. Girl Scouts 
in Cross Plains are part of the Heart of 
Texas Council which serves more than 
thirty-five hundred members in central 
Texas.

The Girl Scout cookie sale is a ma­

jor fund raising project held annually 
to help enable the important work of 
Girl Scouting to be carried out in our 
community. The sale provides a sound 
program experience for girls.

This year’s cookie sale will en­
courage girls to be “ in tune” with 
themselves, their world and their 
future, as the funds raised provided 
troops with many opportunities that 
they could not otherwise afford. While 
Girl Scouting is lots of fun for each 
girl, it is also a growing and learning 
experience. The cookie sale is design­
ed to help girls leam about a variety of 
areas including: sales techniques,
money management, planning and 
goal-setting. Girls become more 
re sp o n sib le  by serv ing  th e ir  
customers, handling money, and plan­
ning what they will do with the profit. 
Through the cookies that each girl 
sells, she can earn her way to summer 
camp and other Girl Scout program 
events.

Girl Scout council president, Janice 
Smith of Weatherford, says that the 
cookie sale is much more than a simple 
fund raising activity. “ As we begin 
our sale this year, we realize that we 
are carrying forward a tradition of

quality — quality program for the girls 
in our communities and a quality pro­
duct for the hundreds of thousands of 
customers who enjoy Girl Scout 
cookies each year,”  Smith said.

While earning is a vital reason for 
the annual cookie sale, learning con­
tinues to be the value that takes 
precedence for the Girl Scout 
organization.

Girls establish their own sales goals. 
They have an opportunity to leam that: 
a well-known product whose quality is 
carefully controlled is easy to sell; 
customers appreciate courtesy, pro­
mptness and reliable delivery of 
goods; effort and initiative are reward­
ed by the incentives and awards 
system; the hard work of each member 
contributes to the shared success of all 
members in reaching program goals.

Girls take pride in earning their own 
way for special events, including sum­
mer camp. They are able to use coun­
cil “ cookie currency" earned during 
cookie sales toward their camp fees. 
Camping facilities were built and are 
maintained through the cookie sale. 
Heart of Texas Girl Scout Council has 
operated a resident camp at Lake 
Brownwood since 1956.

Planning and decision making, an 
important part of the Girl Scout pro­
gram, are also on inherent part of the 
cookie sale. It offers girls an oppor­
tunity to set goals for a special project, 
to make worthwhile choices for the 
use of money, to establish and live 
within a budget, to be responsible for 
management of their own bank ac­
count.

According to president Smith, the 
Girl Scout cookie sale is not perceived 
by the public as just another fund drive 
for very good reasons.

“ Girl Scouts have been selling 
cookies for more than Fifty-six years. 
In a sense, we have raised our own 
market. Grown up Girl Scouts who are 
wives and mothers today have fond 
memories of their cookie selling days. 
They remember being scared to death 
to knock on that first door to make that 
first sale, and they remember that each 
new sale made them walk a little taller 
as they discovered, friendly, in­
terested, caring support of their Girl 
Scout aims, ”  Smith said.

For more information about the Girl 
Scout Cookie Sale in our area, contact 
Terry Jane Wyatt at 725-7762.

the husband of the former Patsye Par­
rish of this city. The couple married 
here in 1956.

At a recent annual dinner-dance of 
Dallas Digital a number of awards 
were presented. During the ceremony. 
Mrs. Robison was called to the 
podium by the corporations’ president 
John Ganiradt and asked to present the 
first of a series of $1.000 scholarships 
to an outstanding Texas high school 
graduate. Recipient of that grant was 
Matthew Ratliff of Lewisville. Mrs. 
Robison was then told that henceforth 
she will designate the school from 
which the honoree will come and she 
will provide the criteria for its selec­
tions.

Mrs. Robison has chosen Cross 
Plains High School, from which both 
she and Homer graduated, and where 
he was one of the most outstanding 
athletes ever to wear the purple and 
gold spangles of the local school.

At present a committee, headed by 
Rolan Jones, a nephew of Mrs. 
Robison, is drafting a set of standards 
which will be submitted for approval. 
Eventually the criteria will be publish­
ed in this and other newspapers.

The Homer Robison Memorial 
Scholarship is believed to be the 
largest cash prize ever offered to a 
local graduate. It is expected to be 
stimulant for excellence and fittingly 
honor the man for whom it is named.

M ore
Democratic
Candidates
File

Three races in the Democratic 
Primary Election set for March 10 will 
be contested after several candidate 
filings this week.

The office of County Sheriff now 
has three candidates vying for the 
position after a Cross Plains man filed.

Donald D. Childers, who lists his 
address at P.O. Box 721 in Cross 
Plains, is the latest to file for County 
Sheriff. The 39-year-old Childers has 
resided in the state 36 years and in 
Callahan County three years. He lists 
his occupation as a farmer/rancher.

Childers is seeking the office of 
County Sheriff along with incumbent 
Sheriff Bill Skinner and Eddie Curtis.

Incumbent County Attorney Brad 
Harris of Clyde will have an opponent 
after a Eula man filed for the County 
Attorney position December 17.

Allen D. Wright, 39, of Rt. I Box 
314 in Clyde, has resided in the state 
19 years and in Callahan County three 
years. Wright lists his occupation as 
an Assistant District Attorney of 
Taylor County.

The office of County Constable 
Precinct (Eula) will also be con­
tested between David Blalock and 
Dahyl Bradshaw.

Blalock, 45, filed December 17 for 
the County Constable position. He 
lists his address at Rt . 2 Box 272-C in 
Clyde. He has lived all his life in 
Texas and all 45 years in Callahan 
County. Blalock lists his occupation as 
a farmer/truck driver.

John Weeks, 42, an Abilene lawyer, 
was the first candidate to file for the 
office of 42nd District Court Judge. 
Weeks will be seeking the position be­
ing vacated by Don Lane, who is retir­
ing.

Candidate filing for positions of 
County Attorney, Tax Assessor- 
Collector, Commissioner Precinct f  I 
(Clyde), Commissioner Precinct #3 
(Baird), County Sheriff and 42nd 
District Court Judge is continuing at 
Hardwich Oil Co. in Baird. Also, the 
positioas of all county precinct con­
stables are up for election.

Jon Hardwick, Callahan County 
Democratic Party Chairman, said that 
filing will continue now until January 
3 at his office located on West 
Highway 80 in Baird. Candidate filing 
forms are located at Hardwick’s office 
or from the Callahan County Clerk’s 
office. J

Candidate filing fees include $600

Continued On Page 2



Colonial Oaks 
Services

%

Cottonwood Baptist Church will 
conduct worship services at Colonial 
Oaks Nursing Home on Sunday, 
December 29, commencing at 3:30 
p.m. Billy Eugene Evans jack Howard Lyon

1991-92 SORORITY FLEDGES -  right) Linda W ilson, R ’Evelyn 
The Alpha Rho Zeta Chapter of Beta Childers, Neoma Nash, Terry Norris, 
Sigma Phi would like to present their and Debbie Gosnell.
1991-92 sorority pledges: (left to

Sorority Meets At Home Of Patricia Stephens
for donating six packages of venison to 
us to distribute.

The following members were pre­
sent: Jamie Apple, Sarah Brashear, 
Janice Buckner, Debra Childers, 
R’Evelyn Childers, Patricia Cook, Joy 
gerking, Debbie Gosnell, Bobbie 
Johnston, Melissa Kemp, Judy Luter, 
Joyce McCoy, Margaret McNeel, 
Neoma Nash, Terry Norris, Nora 
Odom, Janice Phillips, Carol Rogers, 
Dora Smith, Patricia Stephens, and 
Linda Wilson.

Sorority Holds Annual

By MELISSA KEMP

The Alpha Rho Zeta Chapter of Beta 
Sigma Phi held its annual Christmas 
party at the home of Judy Luter. There 
were 24 members present and 1 ab­
sent.

The members enjoyed a wonderful 
coveted, dish supper hosted by Judj&i'a 

Secret Sister gifts' were- distributed, 
and the gifts were opened for everyone 
to see.

Members then drew numbers and 
participated in a Chinese Christmas 
gift exchange. This is where the box­
ing match began, luckily there were no 
injuries. Hopefully, each person was 
happy with the gift they wound up 
with.

The following members were pre­
sent: Jamie Apple, Sarah Brashear, 
Janice Buckner, Debra Childers, 
R’Evelyn Childers, Patricia Cook, 
Mary Dunn, Joy Gerking, Debbie 
Gosnell, Bobbie Johnston, Melissa 
Kemp, Judy Luter, Joyce McCoy, 
Margaret McNeel, Wanda Merryman, 
Terry Norris, Nora Odom, Janice 
Phillips, Judy Phillips, Carol Rogers, 
Dora Smith, Patricia Stephens, Linda 
Wilson, and Paul Winfrey.

Boxing Match

By MELISSA KEMP

The Alpha Rho Zeta Chapter of Beta 
Sigma Phi met at the home of Patricia 
Stephenson December9, 1991. There 
were 21 members present and 4 ab- '
sent.

Everyone was congratulated for do­
ing a great job in preparing for the 
Parade of Homes. The sorority would 
like to personally thank the families 
that opened their homes for the public 
to view. We certainly appreciated their 
generosity, and we appreciate all those 
that toured these lovely homes.

Joy Gerking informed the sorority 
that three more boxes of canned goods 
were distributed to families. The 
sorority would like to thank the Boy 
Scouts for donating several big boxes 
of canned goods and Donna Wagner
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BURKETT — Billy Eugene Evans, 
62, died Thursday, December 19, 
1991, at a Temple hospital.

Services were held at 2 p.m. Sunday 
at Stevens Funeral Home Chapel with 
the Rev. J.L. Gandy officiating, 
assisted by the Rev. Jerry Jackson. 
Burial was in Coleman Cemetery.

Mr. Evans was bom and attended 
school in Coleman. He served in the 
U.S. Air Force from 1948-51. He was 
a longtime resident of Coleman and a 
member of Echo Community Church.

Survivors include his wife, Vera 
Lee Evans of Burkett; a daughter, An­
na RA Jones of Centerville; a son, 
Larry Evans of Houston; a brother, 
Jay Evans of Burkett; a stepmother, 
Cora Lee Evans of Coleman; two step­
sisters, Mary Ann Jackson and Edith 
Rose Evans, both of Coleman; two 
aunts; five grandchildren; and several 
nieces and nephews.

Christopher Daiti 
Cogbum

RISING STAR — Christopher 
Dain Cogbum, 16, died Saturday, 
December 21, 1991, at an Abilene 
hospital.

Services were held at 2 p.m. Sunday 
at Higginbotham Funeral Home 
Chapel with the Rev. Dick Williams 
officiating. Burial was in Stag Creek 
Cemetery in Comanche County.

Mr. Cogbum was bom in De Leon 
and was a Methodist.

Survivors include his father, Bickey 
Cogbum of Childress; his mother, 
Judy Cogbum of Clyde; maternal 
grandparents, Billy Paul and Mary 
Ann Underwood of Rising Star; a 
paternal grandmother, Madeline 
Cogbum of De Leon; a brother, Vic­
tor Travis Cogbum of Clyde; and a 
sister, Brandi Dawn Cogbum of 
Clyde.

R. B. ‘Britt’Andrews

S  COLEMAN — R.B. ‘‘Britt” An­
drews, 79, died Tuesday, December 
17, 1991, in a Brownwood hospital.

Services were held at 2:30 p.m. 
Thursday at Stevens Funeral Home 
Chapel with Dr. Charles Sheffield of­
ficiating. Burial was in Coleman 
Cemetery.

Mr. Andrews was bom in Moran in 
Shackelford County where he grew up 
and attended school. He and his wife 
moved to Coleman in 1949.

He was a retired oilfield pumper and 
a member of Concho Baptist Church.

Survivors include his wife, Alice 
Geneva Andrews of Coleman; two 
daughters, Linda Carol Kerr and Terri 
Linn (Mrs. Wayne) Moore, both of 
Coleman; two brothers, Richmond 
Andrews of Rule and Reynard An­
drews of Odessa; three grandchildren; 
and two great-grandchildren.
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Wc wish you Good 
Health, Happiness 
and Prosperity every 
day of the year in 1992!

£

Happy New ̂

You can expect
r ' - the BEST from your
Hometown, Independent Bank.

♦ That’s Us!

I QUM N O _  _  _ ___^
LENDER P.0. BOX 699

Cross Plains, Texas 76443

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK Phone (817) 725-6141 or 

725-6142

DENVER, Colo. — Jack Howard 
Lyon, 35, died Friday, December 12. 
1991, in a local hospital after a lengthy 
illness.

Memorial services were Monday at 
B uddhist C om m unity  C en te r. 
Graveside services were held at 2 p.m. 
Thursday at Evergreen Cemetery in 
Ranger with the Revs. E.B. Elswick 
and Darrell Dossey officiating.

Mr. Lyon was bom to Weslaco, 
moved to Denver 26 years ago from 
Borger, and was in the restaurant 
business in Denver for many years.

Survivors include his father and 
stepmother, Gene and Reba Lyon of 
Rising Star; two sisters, Paula Barber 
of Denver and Marilyn Jordan of Lit­
tleton, Colo.; two step-brothers, 
Royce Minnick of Fort Worth and 
Charlie Minnick of Lubbock; and 
several nieces and nephews.

COLONIAL OAKS 
NURSING HOME 

NEWS

By LINDA EDINGTON 
Activity Director

Midge McCall, Floye Cassle, and 
Juanita Rhodes thoroughly enjoyed an 
evening out on the town viewing the 
beautiful Christmas lights. Special 
thanks to two of our employees, Ruby 
Cassle and Reba Lane, for taking these 
ladies out for such an enjoyable ride.

The residents had enjoyed some 
pretty Christmas Caroling by the Girls 
Scouts tt2\5 and also from the Cub 
Scouts. They were proud of the 
wreaths and candy canes the Cub 
Scouts made for their doors. We do 
appreciate you all for thinking of us.

Our appreciation to these fine folks, 
Dan and Nancy Childress for the cute 
Christmas centerpiece; to Dorothy 
Burtlow for the delicious homemade 
cookies and candy she sent us from 
Hendrick LA; and to Rev. Michael 
Hale, the Garden Club, Bill Strickler, 
and Alton McCowen for being a part 
of our Open House.

Residents with birthdays this month 
were Helen Wood, H.H. McDermett, 
Joyce Strickland, Clara Coburn, and 
Opal Criswell.

Cub Scouts — Alex Clark, Nicholas 
Dimitri, Bryan Strickler, Casey 
Dudley, Greg and Travis Black, Cody 
Reed, T.J. and Chris Harris, Ryan 
Hale, Joseph Dillard, Mac Teaff, 
Chris Sliger, A.J. Carouth, Cole 
Koenig, and Linda Reed were here 
singing Christmas Carols.

Betty Beggs was here visiting May 
Bell Odom.

Brandi Monsey visited with Muddy 
Wood.

Vera Pearl Bunnell came by to say 
hello to Virginia Campbell and Vera 
Ferrell.

Bob Lane was here visiting several.
Lucille Gould from Burkett and 

Grace Green were here visiting with 
Joyce Strickland. Bill Strickland is 
here daily.

Girl Scouts tt2\5 — and helpers, 
Tabitha Clark, Jodi Payne, LeaJean 
Wyatt, Elizabeth McCarty, Brittany 
Bennett, Laci Key, Bea Kay Bell, 
Jessica Childers, Brandy Hutton, 
Shannadon Black, Jessie Dudley, 
Christine Hargrove, Scott Hutton, 
Mikey Bennett, Brook Callaway, Pam 
Hutton, Andy Bennett, and Sheri Ben­
nett.

Activities during the week:
Monday: Bingo winners were 

Lucille Stone (2), Floye Cassle, An­
nabel Vaught (3), Vera Belyeu (2), 
E.K. Coppinger, Madie Chambers, 
Midge McCall (3), Ressa Glover, Ber­
tha Hoyt (3), Clevia Ringhoffer (2), 
and Juanita Rhodes. Exercise class.

Tuesday: Art class. Bible study and 
music with Jeanell Purvis.

Wednesday: Sing-a-long with 
Clyde Linker, Sally Roady, Pearl 
Greenwood, Vera Pearl Bunnell, and 
Ruby McCowen. Exercise class.

Thursday: Line folding. Domino 
games.

Friday: Bingo winners were Ressa 
Glover (3), Madie Chambers, Vera 
Belyeu (2), Ruby Cassle, Lucille 
Stone (2), and Midge McCall.

Sunday: Church services by the 
Believer’s Fellowship.

God Bless you, love you, keep 
you...during the New Year and 
always.

CANDIDATES
Continued From Page 1

for the office of County Commis­
sioner. Tax Assessor-Collector and 
Sheriff. Filing fee for County At­
torney is $1,000 and 42nd District 
Court Judge filing fee is $1,200. The 
Count) Precinct Constable filing fee is 
$300.

Other candidates filing earlier in­
clude:

— Bill Skinner. 58. of Baird, filed 
December 9 for the office of County 
Sheriff.

— Brad Harris. 38. of Clyde, filed 
December 6 for the office of County 
Attorney.

— Dahyl Bradshaw, 40. of Clyde, 
filed December 19 for the office of 
County Constable Precinct #5 (Eula).

— Roy LaFoy, 52, of Clyde, filed 
December 3 for the office of Commis­
sioner Precinct tt 1 (Clyde).

Tommy Holland. 58. of Baird, filed 
December 3 for the office of Commis­
sioner Precinct tt3 (Baird).

— Eddie Curtis. 40. of Baird, filed 
December 3 for the office of County 
Sheriff.

The new voter and commissioner 
precinct boundaries, approved by the 
county commissioners, will take effect 
January 1 in time for the March 10 
primary election.

To file for public office, a candidate 
must be at least 18 years of age. a 
registered voter and a resident of the 
county or commissioner precinct the 
candidate is filing for. A candidate can

by-pass the filing fee by obtaining a 
petition with the required number of 
registered voters.

Candidate filing for county public 
office will continue during regular 
business office hours until January 3. 
The Democratic Primary Election will 
be held Tuesday. March 10. in 
Callahan County.

2 Locally Known Young 
Men Graduate From 
Texas College Of Law

Scott Nabers of Houston graduated 
from Texas College of Law Wednes­
day. December 17.

The young man is known in Cross 
Plains, having frequently visited here 
with his grandparents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Scott. His mother is the former 
Mary Scott, a Cross Plains native, and 
his father is Lynn Nabers. who 
represented this and a number of other 
nearby counties during a 16-year ten- 
ture in the Texas Legislature. The re­
cent law school graduate is married to 
the former Donna Harrison of 
Houston.

R ece iv in g  h is D o c to r o f 
Jurisprudence degree along with 
Nabers and 137 other members of the 
class, was Stanley Kent Coppinger of 
East Texas, a kinsman of the pro­
minently known Coppinger family of 
the Cross Plains area and the son of* 
Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Coppinger of 
Carrollton.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
CROSS PLAINS (817) 725-7629

..................... 9:45 a m.
................... 11:00 am.
..................... 6:00 p.m.
..................... 7:00 p.m.
..................... 7:00 p.m.
Rob Sarles, Muslc/Youth — 725-7550

10TH & MAIN
Sunday School...........
Morning Worship.........
Church Training..........
Evening Worship.........
Wed. Prayer Service.....
Michael Hale, Pastor — 725-7556

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
North Main at George Scott Cross Plains. Texa

Sunday School......9:45 a m. Morning W orship.......  10:45 a.m
Sunday Scripture — Luke 2:41-52 

Sermon By Gideon Speaker
Transportation Available — Call Jimmielee 725-7538 

Rev. Susan Trammell, Pastor 735-7377

UNITED PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH
9TH & AVE. D CROSS PLAINS
WORSHIP SERVICE...................................................... 9:30 A.M.
BIBLE CLASS.............................................................. 10:30 A.M.

Ja s p e r  McClellan. P asto r
Everyone Welcome

BELIEVER’S FELLOWSHIP
Undenominational —  Evangelical

Sunday School....................EASTHIGHWAY 36........................
Morning Worship........................................................................
Evening Worship.............................................................. ...........
Wednesday Night Family Bible S tudy.........................................

Charlie Fortenberry, Pastor 725-6607

UNITED PENTECOSTAL CHURCH
9th & N . Main Cross Plains

‘  ‘Spirit Filled Worship
Morning W orship...............
Evening W orship.................
Wednesday Bible S tudy......
Phillip R. Schaefer, Pastor

... 10:00 a.m. 

... 6:30 p.m. 

... 7.30 p.m. 
817-725-7140

TEMPLE BAPTIST CHURCH
Sunday School......T * " '
Sunday Morning Worship ..
Sunday Evening...............
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 
Rodney Mulvane, Pastor

Bible Missions To Am erica
Office Building at 1 M«tus Way Cross Plains. Texas 76443 817*725*7143 

David Holmes Missionary Teacher

SOUND TEACHING FOR GOD-FEARING FAMILIES 
.Esteeming Truth, Righteousness and the Gospel of peace 6U:1(M7 

.Discipling beyond more empty religion naMt-TC 
.Calling all to visible discipled obedience of the faith ta.15

Biblical -  Conservative -  Conclusive -  Alive -  Joyful 
Representing the holy God Who effectively saves bad people 66.1:10-20

* Sunday: Family Bible Teaching 1 0 -1 130AM, 6:30-7:30PM
Wednesdays: 6:30PM ...

ALL W ELCOME A accepted on thdir merits. ML7;12

u*•*



Bryan Farmer Named To 
Callahan ASC Committee

L
MRS. TRAVIS HAYDEN THOMAS

Merrill-Thomas Exchange 
Wedding VowsNovember22

Bryan Farmer, a well-known Callahan 
County farmer, was named to the county

f  m in u t e  |
'•MUSINGSi
S m m m m m m m m m *

By ESTHLOY S. DICKSON
0

The First ‘tale’ I’m going to tell this 
morning is on myself, and ‘it ain’t fun­
ny, Magee’. I walked out on my front 
porch (last F riday m orning), 
discovered it was ice-covered, skidded 
down the frozen steps and ‘flipped’ 
over on the lawn. I skinned my knee­
cap and my shin — they are very sore 
now.

Church services were beautiful on 
Sunday morning. Colorful panels at 
least ten feet tall (King of Kings and 
Lord of Lords) were displayed at the 
beginning of the services. The pastor 
described the virgin birth of our Lord 
a “ crucial occurrence" — a lovely 
sermon.

My neighbor, John Burleson, called 
me last week and asked if I still wanted 
that old tree on the highway taken 
down. This morning he and some 
‘helpers’ took the tree down and haul­
ed it off. I’m sincerely grateful. They 
picked up a truck-load of debris from 
that area.

Sally Roady told me so much news!
I hope I get it straight! Her brother, 
Gene Hicks and Nancy of Rising Star 
were here one day. Their son, George, 
came in from Dallas on Friday and 
will be here until New Year’s Day. 
Cindy and Jim came in on Tuesday. 
N.A. Getty of Baird visited one day. 
Cada and Glenn Gipson of Olton, 
Texas visited with the N.A. Roadys 
last week.

Betty Beggs visited last Saturday 
with a neighbor, Mrs. C.T. Barton. 
Mr. and Mrs. Mack Taff visited with 
them recently. All the Beggs families 
were in Sunday School and church on 
Sunday.

Ms. Jewel Foster was going strong 
mis morning. She attended the 
Christmas program at Pioneer Baptist 
Church last evening. She said it was 
very interesting. ___ ____ J,

Ms. Nell Fleming visited on Sunday
ith Novilla Barton. Jolena and Jason 

Fleming were visiting today with Nell.
I’m wishing for all my friends and 

neighbors a great and successful New 
Year!

A g ric u ltu ra l S ta b il iz a tio n  and 
Conservation committee by delegates to 
the county ASC convention, held 
Tuesday, December 10,1991.

Local administrative area (LAA) 
boundaries were set by the ASC 
committee in compliance with changes 
required by the Food Security Act of 
1985. LAA’s help provide farmers with 
effective farm program administration 
through local representation. The 
delegates also elected John Straley and 
Jack Landers to three-year terms as fust 
and second alternates to the county 
committee. Terms begin January 1, 
1992.

Bryan Farmer is a member of farming 
partnership, J & B. Farms, along with 
his dad, Jack Farmer. Together they 
farm wheat and feed grain in the Eula 
and Clyde areas of Callahan County. A 
cow/calf operation rounds out the 
partnership.

John Straley and Jack Landers ranch in 
the Oplin and Ovalo areas respectively. 
In addition to ranching, both produce 
wheat and hay.

The county ASC com m ittee is 
responsible for local administration of 
government farm programs such as the 
wheat, feed grain and peanut programs, 
conservation programs, including the 
CRP programs and commodity loan 
programs.

Eligibility for participation in all 
programs administered by ASCS is 
established by law without regard to 
race, color, religion, sex, age, national 
origin, marital status, physical or mental 
handicap.

Temple Baptist 
Watch Nite 
Service Dec. 31

The Temple Baptist Church, located 
at the comer of 8th and Avenue D, 
will have a Watch Nite Service on 
December 31, beginning at 7:30 p.m. 
until midnight.

Lester Swann, former pastor of 
Merriman Baptist Church in Ranger, 
will bring the message.

Two Christian films, ‘‘Sammy’’ — 
the story of a young crippled boy, and
“ Paradise Trail”  — a western with

.  _ —  . ■  » — * ■  ■ ^  . .  ■ > > .  -  .  ^ >

Christian values taught, will be 
shown.

Food and fellowship will be abun­
dant. The Temple Baptist Church in­
vites you to join them in their New 
Year’s Eve activities.

Kimberly Lorain Merrill and Travis 
Hayden Thomas were united in mar­
riage at 7:30 p.m. Nov. 22, in the 
First United Methodist Church. G.D. 
Justice, grandfather of the bride, of­
ficiated the ceremony.

The bride is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Merrill of Pioneer and 
the granddaughter of Lorain Merrill of 
Pioneer. The groom is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Russell Thomas of 
Brownwood and the grandson of 
Mozelle Thomas of Potosi.

The guests were registered by Tona 
Tankersley and Deborah Fiscus. Wed­
ding programs and rice bags were 
handed out by Mindy Cunningham. 
The registery table held the bride's 
book, a plume pen and a portrait of the 
bride displayed on an easel. The table 
was covered with an ivory tablecloth.

The first three pews of the church 
were dressed in natural paper ribbon 
bows with clusters of dried navy, 
cream and rust flowers with ivory oak 
leaves and stalks of natural wheat at­
tached to brass luminaires. The back 
church pews were decorated with mat­
ching pew markers. The altar rails 
were covered with grapevine entwined 
with English ivy, accented with dried 
large blue and rust berries, ivory oak 
leaves and three vanilla candles ac­
cented natural paper ribbon bows with 
wheat sprays. The altar area was fram­
ed with an ivory lattice background 
with three large Boston ferns and pot­
ted candlelight chrysanthemums. A 
unity candle was set in the center of 
the altar on an oak table with a brass 
cross.

Johnette Alexander, aunt of the 
groom , was organist for the 
ceremony. As the bride and groom’s 
family were escorted to their seats, 
“ Wind Beneath My Wings,”  and 
“ Twelfth of Never” was played. 
Cecille Davis and Debbie Harris, 
cousins of the groom, sang a duet of 
“ Forever is as Far as I’ll G o,” follow­
ed by a solo by Mrs. Davis of “ You 
Are My Soul and Inspiration.”  The 
traditional “ Wedding March” was 
played for the entrance of the atten­
dants. The bride’s entrance was an­
nounced with chimes and the “ Wed­
ding March.” F lo w in g  the nuptials, 
Mrs. Davis sang “ You Are Doubly 
Blessed.” The recessional was the 
traditional “ Wedding March” from 
“ A Midsummer Night’s Dream.”

The bride, given in marriage by her 
parents and sisters, was escorted to the 
altar by her father. She wore a formal 
gown of imported ivory taffeta. The 
fitted bodice was embellished with 
pearlized Alencon lace that enhanced 
the crisscross portrait taffeta collar. 
The sheer sleeves featured a petal 
point cuff accented with pearlized mat­
ching lace. The full taffeta skirt was 
embellished with scattered AJencon 
lace motifs. Pearlized lace edged the 
cathedral length train.

To complete her ensemble, she 
chose a lace tiara accented with 
rhinestone and crystals enhanced with 
a full French pouf attached to a three 
tier cathedral length veil. She wore 
ivory lace-up ropers with a six-pence 
and a penny for good luck. She wore a 
blue garter made by her mother, pearl 
earrings which were a gift from the 
groom and a pearl necklace which was 
a gift from her grandmother.

Her bouquet was an airy arrange­

ment of antique ivory roses, 
a ls troem eria , g a rd en ias , daisy 
chrysanthemums and Queen Anne 
lace. The country theme was brought 
in with dried wheat and trailing 
English ivy. She also carried a lace 
handkerchief which was carried by the 
groom’s mother in her wedding.

Linda Strickland served as matron 
of honor. Bridesmaids were Shelley 
Satterfield and Tami Thomas, sister of 
the groom. They were attired in ivory 
Victorian blouses with ivory lace high 
collars, set-in yokes and fitted sleeves, 
all of ivory lace. The skirts were navy 
wool ankle length with a high-waisted 
Western yoke. They carried nosegay 
arrangements with spider chrysan­
themums, dried pepper weed, navy 
ribbon and wheat sprays.

The younger wedding party atten­
dants wore matching hair barrettes. 
The girls dresses were ivory ankle 
length skirts with fitted bodice and ac­
cented with a bow at the back waist. 
The boys wore navy tuxedo jackets 
with ivory shirts, navy bow ties and 
starched Wrangler blue jeans.

Flower girl was Myleah Yarbrough 
of Abilene, niece of the bride. Ring 
bearer was Clay Koenig, nephew of 
the bride. Train bearers were Shanda 
McClure, niece of the bride and Cole 
Koenig, nephew o f the bride. 
Candlelighters were Michael McClure 
of Potosi, nephew of the bride and 
Rain Gray.

The groom was attired in a navy tail 
coat, ivory shirt and starched 
Wrangler jeans. He wore a navy bow 
tie and black bullhide lace-up ropers. 
His boutonniere was made of 
alstroemeria, ivory roses and wheat.

Best man was Trent Thomas, 
brother of the groom. Groomsmen 
were Travis Pierce and David Croft. 
They wore navy tuxedo jackets with 
starched blue jeans and boots. Their 
boutonnieres were alstroemeria and 
wheat.

Ushers were Matt Strickland, Terry 
French, and Les Salenski.

The fathers of the bride and groom 
wore navy tuxedo jackets with ivory 
shirts, starched jeans and navy bow 
ties.

The bride’s mother chose a two 
piece navy suit with floral cut out 
lapels. Her blouse was of ivory silk. 
She chose ivory shoes to complete her 
ensemble.

The groom’s mother chose a two 
piece emerald green suit with a split 
skirt. The suit was accented with ivory 
crochet lace on the yoke. She chose 
black accessories. <

The mothers and grandmothers 
wore corsages of gardenias with ivory 
picot ribbon.

A reception was held immediately 
following the ceremony in the 
fellowship hall of the church. At the 
entrance hall of the church, an ivory 
lace covered table held pictures of the 
bride and groom in childhood years to 
their wedding day.

The bnde’s table was covered with 
an ivory lace tablecloth. The four 
tiered wedding cake was almond 
flavored with apricot filling between 
the layers and ivory icing." Fresh 
flowers matching the bride’s bouquet 
were placed atop each layer. The tiers 
were supported with tall swirled 
crystal columns. The top layer was 
made in the shape of a horseshoe with

The Movie Store
CHRISTMAS VACATION HOURS

Seven Days A Week —  1 p.m. - 8 p.m.
New Arrivals Weekly

CLOSED
CHRISTMAS DAY — NEW YEAR’S DAY

We Appreciate Your Business
38-lie

ROBERT E. McCOOL
Attorney At Law

Law Offices at
235 Market St. 

Baird, Texas 79504
(915) 854-1016

NEW  YEAR 
SPECIALS

N EW  ‘91 E X P L O R E R  
2 door, air, power 

steering, power brakes, 
AM/FM, Interval wipers 

& more

$13,577

‘88 L IN C O L N  
TO W N  C A R  

All options & high c la ss  
for only

$7,495

• »

N E W  ‘91 F O R D  
X LT  C R E W C A B  

D O O L E Y
Diesel, 5 speed, loaded 

with options. After 
. rebate

$ 1 8 ,6 5 9

NO TRIPS - NO TV’s - NO PRIZES 
No Gimmicks, just good prices

JOHNSTON FORD
(817) 725-6181

1-800-792-2942  W atts • C io s s  P la in s, Texas

I

fresh flowers in the center. English i\ > 
cascaded down to the lower la>ers. 
Next to the larce cake were two. threew
tiered cakes with a cnstal staircase 
connecting in the middle with a round 
platform holding a cake topper of a 
cowbov groom and bnde w uh an i\or> 
lace heart with horseshoe nail head> 
and wheat surrounding the couple. 
The cake was made bv the bnde’s 
mother and decorated by Cheryl Mc­
Clure. sister of the bnde. The punch 
was served from a silver punch howl 
accented with gold. The bnde s hou- 
quet was the centerpiece. Apricot 
flavored mints were in the shape of 
horseshoes, hats and boots.

A fruit buffet table held an asson- 
ment of double dippvd chocolate 
strawberries. The centerpiece was a 
large fruit tower served on a mirror 
trav. Tropical fruit planers and a 
vegetable tray were served.

The groom's table was covered w uh 
a rust tablecloth. His cake was an 
original design of a standing Western 
hat made of German chocolate with 
rolled icing. Also on the table was a 
silver chaffing dish with mini 
sausages, a horn of cheddar cheese, 
crackers, mixed nuts and peppermint 
mints of Western design. Coffee was 
served from a silver service. All mints 
were made by Teresa Koenig, sister of 
the bride.

A children’s table was decorated 
with blue and ivory helium balloons. 
Tea cake cookies and punch was serv - 
ed at a small table with chairs.

Serving in the houseparty were 
Kristi McAnally, Cindy McAnallv, 
Sallie Watson. Sondra Johnson. Lon 
Brock and Rain Gray, all cousins of 
the bride and groom, and Tona 
Tankersley and Mindy Cunningham.

Rice bags filled with birdseed and 
wedding confetti were on the buffet 
tables.

For going away, the bride chose a 
two piece suit with a split riding skirt 
made of suedecloth. The blouse was 
accented with large silver conchos. 
The groom wore coordinating Panhan­
dle Slims western shirt, starched 
Wrangler jeans and boots.

The bride is a 1988 graduate of 
Cross Plains High School and a 1991

graduate of Cisco Junior College.
The groom is a 1987 graduate of 

Brownwood High Sctu\i| and a 19 9 1 
graduate ot Cisco Junior College. He 
is emploved with the City of 
Brownwoixl.

Following a wedding trip to the
Stageccuch Inn in Salado. the couple
will reside in Brownwood.

A rehearsal dinner was hosted b\ the
•

parents of the groom. The dinner was 
catered by the Bar-B-Que Bam in 
Lampasas. Decorations were ceramic 
hoots with dried flowers of navv. rust.

m

and ivory. Haystacks were placed 
hrside the boots with English ivy and 
navy ceramic Western hats.

Out of town relatives attending the 
wedding were from Tennessee. 
Austin. Arlington. Fort Worth, and 
Abilene.

H Food Plain
Weekly Dell Special

Hotdogs
2 for $1.00

Come On Down And Try Seme!

INSURANCE A  MORE, INC
"The Health and Life Insurance People."

I f  you are not sure what you really need,
we will try to help.

Corns by, call us or write us, 
we will come see you.

Check our annuities fo r safety and rate of 
interest Before you put that money aw ay

fo r savings, retirement, etc.

9158932115 
P.O. Drawer RR

202 Oak St.
Clyde, Texas 79510 

Knox Waggoner - Owner
J

F E R G U S O N S

DRY CLEANING "LAUNDRY
SERVICE

SERVING
PALO PINTO, EASTLAND, ERATH, 

HOOD, AND CALLAHAN COUNTIES.

NOW  AT 
FOOD PLAZA 

IN CROSS PLAINS
OPENING SPECIAL

Dry Cleaning Vi Price 
Starched Jeans 51"

DAILY PICKUP AND DELIVERY
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Stroud Shamrock 
Station

Stowaway Mini 
Storage

A. H. McCowen 
Construction

Higginbotham

Cubelle L. Harris, 
District Clerk

Homines
Automotive

Reed Construction

C Enterprises 
Benny Callaway

The Following Businesses
Wish You A Very Happy

And

, j V IJ O '

pot of gold 
good health, happiness and love.

Johnson's Dry 
Goods

Brad Harris, 
County Attorney

Russell-Surles 
Abstract Co.

Johnston Truck & 
Supply

Cross Plains 
Business Service

Cross Plains 
Food Locker

Lawrence Farm & 
Ranch Inc.

Colonial Oaks 
Nursing Home

Rose Butane Gas 
Service

Greenwood
Insurance

Hinkle TV Service

R. G. Maxwell 
Construction

Susan J. Schaefer, 
C.P.A.

Sewalt Butane Co

Skeet Walker 
Truck & Trailer

Cliff's
Texaco Station

Cross Plains 
Petroleum

Pioneer 
Farmers Co-Op

Morris Printing & 
Stationery

Cross Plains 
Review



PUmiNTHE CLASSIFIED
ADS

7 2 5 - 6 1 1 1

Fast Results ii 
the Classified-t.

BAD PERSONAL HYGIENE 
CAN BE GROUNDS FO R DISM ISSAL

Dear Commissioner Nabers,
Some of my co-workers have 

complained about me to my em­
ployer. They say I have an offensive 
body odor. My employer warned 
me that if I didn’t do something to 
correct this I could be fired. I eat a 
large amount of garlic for health

DOWN HOME
Continued From Page 1

deadly parvo disease took her.
There is nothing sweeter than pup­

pies and they make a great Christmas 
gift. At present we do not have any 
dogs, because, the agony of losing 
them is sometimes too much. Kye’s 
Bear, a beautiful American Eskimo, 
was ran over and he missed him so 
much.

Bear followed him everywhere and I 
knew exactly what neighbor Kye was 
visiting, as Bear would be lying in the 
yard patiently waiting. If he left his 
cap somewhere he would guard it until 
he returned. I know he would have 
protected him from any harm.

You can see why someone cleverly 
named them “ man’s best friend.’’

I MARTIN’ S HEATING St ■ 
I AIR CONDITIONING ■
| HC 30 Box 170-30 * I  
I Lake Brownwood. Texas 76801 g

(915) 784-5449 |
Emergency 784-6475

21-nc

Tex X  SCAN
i »r  . . .  m . inumxmnom U n D ra  utaw jg

I

J

HAPPY JACK TRIVERM ICIDE: recog­
nized tale A effective by Center for Veterl-

worms in dogs & cats. Available O T -C  at 
farmer co-ops & better feed stores.
MOTEL FOR S ALE by owner, 16 units tef 
apt., laundry, Just remodeled, money maker, 
only motel In town, wfl trade and finance. 
016-663-3033.
W OLFF TANNING BEDS: New commer­
cial-home units from $100. Lamps, lotions, 
acces sories. Montiily payments iow asflfl. 
C a l today. FREE NEW color catalog. 1-

LONQ HAUL TBUCtQNQ: Get into a high 
demand career as an owner/operator with 
nortiiAmerican Van Unesl Operate your 
ow n  tractor. If you don't have one, we offer 
a te a t  purchaie program that is ona of 
tite best in the industry. No experience 
n t o t i n r y .  it you nooo craning, wo w i  
train you, tuition freel You must be 21, have 
a good driving record, and pass substenoe 
abuse test Call nodhAmerican for infor­
mation package. 1 -600-348-2147. Ask for 
operator 468.
T RA CERS W ANTED: No experience nec­
essary. Part-time. O w i hours. Process FHA 
Mortgage refunds. 1-600-776-5872 or 1- 
800-827-9965.
PIO NEER STEEL BU ILD INGS W INTER 
8 P E C IA L : 24X30X10 $2,995
30X50X12...$4,695; 30X75X12...$6,841 
40X80X12.. $8,941;50X100X14.. .$12,996 
80X100X14...$19,995. A l dzes. MW- 
storege. Financing. 1-000-637-5414.
COVENANT TRANSPORT: Hiring Sector 
trailer drivers. *1 yr. O.T.R. experience 
•Single 19-22* *East coast pay 'Incentive 
pay -Benefits package 'Mnimum age 23
•Tewns 27-31 c 1-600-441-4394.

C O M M IS S IO N E R

M ary Scott 
N abers

* V,

TEXAS BUSINESS TODAY

reasons and that does create an 
odor. Can I be fired for this?

T.R.
Houston

Dear T.R.,
An employer can terminate 

someone for not taking corrective 
action to reduce body odor. Body 
odor falls under the category of 
personal hygiene, which is not a 
protected category under any 
state or federal anti-discrimina­
tion law. If this odor is caused by 
a substance you are taking for a 
medical condition and you are 
terminated, you might be quali­
fied to draw unemployment be­
nefits under the medical ex­
emption. However, you should 
first get your condition verified 
by a medical doctor.

I recommend that you 
contact the Texas Commission on 
Human Rights concerning any 
questions you have about job 
discrimination.

Dear Commissioner Nabers,
My company is having to make 

some cutbacks due to the poor 
economy. Before we lay off any 
employees, we would like to offer 
an incentive package to our work­
ers to possibly encourage some of 
them to voluntarily quit. If the em­
ployees who accept the offer were 
to apply for unemployment 
benefits, could they draw unem­
ployment?

D.N.
Dallas

Dear D.N.,
If a person chooses to accept 

your incentive package and quit, 
he would be disqualified from 
drawing unemployment benefits 
because it would be viewed by 
TEC as a voluntary quit On the

Tho temperature of the earth's In­
terior increases by one degree for 
every 60 feet down.

.  E X P E R T  B O D Y  W O R K  A N D  P A IN T IN G

■ BARRETT BODY SHOP
fc  -  . C L A U D E  C H A M P IO N , O W N E R
J eo w Tiqn cars  a 9 1 5" ^77"^924 A B IL E N E , T X .79603
■LUXURY CARS ____  24  H R . W R E C K E R  S E R V IC E

214 N , L E G G E T T  915-^72^4064

Where to write your elected officials
«

Austin
Ann R ichards, Governor. Room  200, State Capitol, Austin, TX. 78711. 

(512-463-2000)
Bob  Bullock. Lieutenant Governor, P.O. Box 12068, Austin, TX. 78711. 

(512-463-0005)
, Qtb Lew is. Speaker of the House, P.O. Box 2910, Austin, TX. 76769 
(512-463-1000)

Temple D ickson, Slate Senator. P.O  Box 12066, Austin, TX. 78711. 512-4634124 
District office: Box 638, Sweetwater, TX. 79556.)

; Steve Cerrfker, State Senator, P.O. Box 12066, Austin. TX. 78711. (512-463-0130) 
Bob  G lasgow , Stats Senator, P.O  Box 12068, Austin, TX. 78711. (512-463-0122) 
Bob  Hunttr. Stats Representative. P.O  Box 2910, Austin, TX.

78769 512-463-0718 (District office A C U  Station Box 7642, Abilene. TX 79699 ) 
David  Counts. Stats Representative. P.O  Box 2910. Austin, TX. 78769 

512-463-0480 (District office: P.O  Box 338. Knox City, Tx. 79529 )
John  C ook  State Repre sentative. P.O. Box 2910, Austin, TX. 78769 

512-463-0656. (District office: 210 W  Elm, Breckenridge, TX. 70024 )
Bob  Turner. State Representative, P.O. Box 2910, Austin, TX. 76024.)
Robert JuneH State Representative. P.O. Box 2910, Austin, TX. 78769. 

(512-463-0472)
W ashington

G eorge Bush, President of the United States, The White House. W ashington. D  C. 
20000. 456-1414)

Lloyd  Bentaen. U.S. Senator, Room  703, Hart Building. W ashington D.C. 20510. 
(202-224-5922)

Phil Gramm. U.S. Senator, Room  370. Russell Building, W ashington D  C  20510. 
(202-224-2934)
. Charles Stenhotm , Congressm an, 17th Texas District. 1226 Longworth Office 
Building, Washington, D.C. 20515. (AbHsn# office: 341 Pine St.. Abilene. Tx. 79604.) 
(202-225-6605)

other hand, if you approached 
him with the choice of accepting 
the offer or being laid ofT, then it 
would most likely be considered a 
layoff and he could qualify for un­
employment.

Due to a recent court ruling, 
there is an important exception to 
the above general rules. If the 
choice is accepting the retirement 
incentive or staying and suffering 
a substantial reduction in the 
benefits and pension package, 
TEC would rule that the claimant 
had good cause to quit, and your 
account would he charged.

Commissioner Mary Scott 
Nabers represents all employers 
on the Texas Employment 
Commission. Questions should 
be addressed to: TEXAS 
BUSINESS TODAY, 638 TEC 
Building, Austin, Texas, 78778.

B U S IN E S S  & 
P R O F E SS IO N A L

D IR E C T O R Y !

Ross L. Jones
Attorney — Industrial Engineer

Open Each Wed.
9 a.m. — Noon
9th &  Main

(Old Dal-Mar Bldg.)

Colem an:

(817) 725-6747 
(915) 625-2146

17-tfc

CROSS PLAINS 
MEDICAL CENTER

902 N. MAIN 
OPEN MONDAY-FRIDAY 

8:30 A.M. — 5 P.M.

(817) 725-7106

Mediplex Home 
Health Care 

Services

(817) 725-7132
912 North Main 

Cross Plains, Texas
31-cfc

Russell Surles•9

Abstract Co.
* •

Prompt A Dependable 
Abstract Service!

337  M a rk e t S tre e t
9

. B a ird , T e x a s  '
Charles Walker, Owner

Susan J; Schaefer, 
O.P.A.

Accounting & Tax
Service

9th  & M a in  
C ro ss  P la in s  :

Phone: 725-6747

Cross Plains
. Business 

Service
916 Main Street 
(817) 725-7712

Hours: 8:30-5:00

REGISTERED 
PROFESSIONAL 

LAND SURVEYOR
. JOHN 0. BURLESON
BOX 365 CROSS PLAINS

817 725-6485

C A R D  O F T H A N K S
Card Of Thanks

The Cross Plains Chamber of Com­
merce would like to thank all who 
volunteered their time to help with the 
hayride and everyone who supported 
the Chamber by riding on the hayride.

A special thanks to Wimpy McCoy 
who donated the use of his pickup and 
trailer and Randy Foster who let us use 
his hay.

Thank you 
Cross Plains 

Chamber of Commerce

P U B L IC  N O T IC E
Public Notice

The Callahan County Commis­
sioners Court requests proposals on 
the Multi-Peril and General Liability 
for Callahan County. The information 
in regards to present coverage may be 
obtained at the County Clerk’s office 
on the first floor of the Courthouse. 
Proposals will be opened on January 
13, 1992 at 10:30 a.m. The Commis­
sioners Court reserves the right to ac­
cept or reject any or all proposals.

39-2lp

FO R  S A L E  ~
FOR YOUR MARY KAY PRO­
DUCTS call Pauniece Oglesby, 
725-6772. Have all Mary Kay 
Cosmetics line in stock — ladies and 
men’s skin care, body and fragrance 
items. Free delivery, Gift Wrapping.
______________________________n-tfc
MONUMENTS AND MEMORIALS
Cliff Kirkham is agent for Riley- 
G ardener M onument Service of 
Hamilton, Texas for the Cross Plains 
area. Contact Cliff Kirkham for com­
plete inform ation on quality 
monuments. Call (817) 725-6500.

I l-rfc

MLS
Supplement

David Holubec 915-286-7370 
Melvin

Reggy Stover 817-725-7370 
Rising Star 32-uc

FOR S A LE

D R A IN  & S E W E R  
R E P A IR

P L U M B IN G  R E P A IR
(  & C ENTERPRISE

BENNY CALLAWAY

7 2 5 -6 2 0 0

W » D o 1 •

PrBirattlliriig)
Most Jobs Printed 
in 1 to 5 Days!

Compare 
Prices an 
See Why 
Our Customers 
Keep Coming Back 
Time After Time I

J id orris
P R IN T IN G  & S T A T IO N E R Y

•55 E 0TH ST 
C R O S S  PLAINS. T E X A S  

(BIT) 7256111

THERE IS STILL A 
DIFFERENCE AT FOOD PLAZA

We are interested in Wring persons who pos­
sess the following qualities: Personal Integrity 
A Dependability. Willingness To Work & Con­
tribute To A Progressive Organization. An 
Ability To Work In A Fast Pacod Work Envi­
ronment An Outgoing Personality With An 
Eagerness To Serve The Public. Personal 
Schedulo Flexibility. Personal Phone Number. 
High School Diploma or Equivalent.
Insurance Now Available For Fult-T ime Em ­
ployees. If You Feel You Meet All Of These 
Criteria, Please Apply A t 
Your Food Plaza In Cross Plains or Call 725- 
6179 (Drug Screening Required).

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS
NEW AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPMENT 
UUISTOU KMC

P L A N T E R S  D IS K S  D R IL L S  
R O LL IN G  C U LT IV A T O R S  

C H IS E L S
______  B E L L  O R  T R A D E

CLARK TRACTOR l  SUPFIT, INC
D E L E O N  (817)893-2061  •
C O M A N C H E  (915 )356 -3922  

WHERE YOUR BUSINESS 
IS APPRECIATED

w
or r Rf

HAY FOR SALE — Heavily fertiliz­
ed Coastal large round bales, prices 
$20-540 per roll. Call (817) 725-6845.

IS-tfc

FOR SALE/OR RENT -  1982 Red 
man Trailer, 14’ X 72’ on 3 lots. 2 
bedroom, 2 bath, washer, dryer, 
refrigerator, stove & dishwasher, 
CH/A, 3 room storage house, 16,500. 
HUD Approved. Call (817) 725-7424.
__________________________________________33-tfc

FOR SALE — Brand new mink coat, 
fox-trimmed, never been worn. (817) 
725-6668._____________ _______ is ap
20 HEAVY BRED SIMMENTAL 
HEIFERS. Call (817) 725-6733 after
5 p.m. )S~rfc

A U T O S  FO R  S A LE
1984 OLDSMOBILE OMEGA,
44,000 miles, must see to appreciate! 
Call (817) 725-6514 after 5 p.m. or 
725-6733. 36-rfc

H E L P  W A N T E D
CO LO N IA L OAKS NURSING 
HOME — Is now taking applications 
for an R.N. Director of Nurses and a 
7-3 weekend R.N. relief. Competitive 
wages will be offered. Contact 
Frances Wolf at (817) 725-6175. tuk
FULL-TIME R.N. position available 
to supervise people in the delivery of 
non-skilled services. The successful 
candidate will be independent, self- 
motivated, good manager of time and 
organized in paper work. Normal 
work week — Monday — Friday, 8-5, 
w/excellent benefits and mileage reim­
bursement. For something different in 
the field of nursing, call Mr. Sanchez 
1-800-825-4499._______________ m u
STAY HOME -  MAKE MONEY.i
Assemble products and earn up to 
$339.84 per week. Amazing Recorded 
M essage Reveals D etails (214) 
601-1517 Dept. 138. *-,*

S IT U A T IO N S  W A N T E D "
BABYSITTING in your home after 
6:00. Call 725-6613, leave message.

37-4*

R E A L E S T A T E
BY OWNER — 36 acres coastal, 
brick, three bedroom, 2 baths, open 
living area, master suite with queen's 
bath, Vh miles out, possible owner 
finance. (817)725-7781.________ 3m>c
FARM FOR SALE — 100 acres, 1 Vi 
miles northeast of Cross Plains, 80 
acre cultivation, 20 acre pastures, 1 % 
minerals. Call (817) 442-1966, (915) 
653-4980._____________________3*-2ic
2 BEDROOM, 1 bath, carport, fenc­
ed back yard. Call (817) 725^204. 
1244 Ave. E. 3V2tp
FOR SALE — 5 city lots on East 11th 
Street. Taxes paid to date. Call (903) 
832-4718 George Shewmaker, Tex­
arkana, TX. 3*2*

346.8 AC. on Hwy. 206 at 
Burkett with 3 BR, 2 B, BRICK 
HOME, 3 tanks, lots of DEER 
and TURKEY, $412.70 A.

90 AC. on Hwy. 206 between 
Cross Plains and Cisco, $300 A.

10 AC. and HOME north of 
Cross Plains, $27,500.

1175 AC. Ranch, 20 miles NW 
of Cross Plains on Pecan Bayou, 
lots, of deer, turkey, and 4 
tanks, $250 A.

W. H. BiU Varner
Appraiser, Abilene 

(915) 672-5657 -  677-8643
3*<fc

B U S IN E S S  S E R V IC E S
CARPET CLEANED, REPAIRED, 
RESTRETCHED, SOLD & IN­
STALLED. New and used Scot- 
chGuarding available. NO CHARGE 
FOR FURNITURE MOVING OR 
ESTIMATE. (817) 725-7720 Dub 
Meador._______________________
DANNY ADAMS CARPET,  
VINYL & TILE INSTALLATIONS
AND SALES; repairs and restretches. 
FR EE ESTIM A TES. Call (817) 
725-6115. 34-<fc
TROY WARD CONSTRUCTION

New homes, additions, or remodeling. 
Commercial or Agrt. bldgs. Bams, 
corrals, etc. Call for free estimate. 
(817)725-6695.

DORA SMITH
Real Estate Broker 

(817) 725-6489 
Cross Plains, Texas

I am SELLING property!!
Let me LIST and SELL yours!

★  PRIME PROPERTY! 119 A.
1near Cottonwood, 4 water wells, 57 

cultivation, good pasture, hun­
ting,  wheel-moving irrigation  
isystem, house site $55,000.

H  3 br., lVi bath brick home, large 
[lot, pool, fence, garage, Tom 
Brvant Addition. REDUCED 
$36,900.
a  22 ac., 3 br., 1U bath, garage.

1all grass, well pecan and fruit 
trees, west o f Rising Star, $30,000 
VET will qualify.
a 234 ac. 3 water wells, tank, 
grass, $385 ac.
itlV i lots close in, utilities,
$ 2,000.

a 2 br . ,  IVt bath,  den,
1 greenhouse, 2 lots, W. Highway 
[36, excellent for residential/com- 
m ercial opportunity!  ONLY  
$17,500.
a 10.5 acres, house, well, 2 miles 

Cottonwood, TTtHKKi, 
Slashed to $10,000. 
a Remodeled 3 bdrm., 2 large lots, 
comer 7th A Ave. A, Reduced to 
$20,000. Owner finance. 
a 5 lots, 2 bdrm. home, very nice, 
by Johnston Trucking, $19,500. 
a 3 bdrm., 2 bath, extra nice, on 
162 ac., water, horse stalls, riding 
arena, stock tanks, REDUCED 
TO $106,900.
a 2 br., 1X bath, extra den. din­
ing, garage, storage, 2 large cor­
ner lots, comer o f 13th A Ave. E, 
$22,000.

JONES REAL ESTATE
** Nice Country home on 8 

acreas 3 BR., 2 %  Bath. Den 

$32,500.

r* 3.77 acres in Cottonwood with 

highway frontage $5,500.

^  3 Bedroom home with wood

burning heater and vinyl siding. 

Located in good neighborhood 

$12,500.
^ 7 5  acres with 3 bedroom home 

2 miles out. Large bam, pens end 

sheds. Good soil and water with 

lots big oak trees. Great hutting 

$100,000.
^  Mobile Home on 2 acres, 3 

bedroom, 2 bath, fireplace, large 

carport, barns and pens. Good 

buy I $16,000.
✓  3 bdrm., 2 B., on 10 A. Fndt

, b an s, pen, 
i, 4Y» ml. out

$ 3 6 ,0 0 0 /
^  82 acres, good hunting, some 

minerals. $400  per acre.

JOHNNIE BLAND 
(817) 725-6293

ROLAN JONES 
(817) 725-7640 

Crow Plains, Tx.
TOrfc

X ,  L  (t / . RtfllTY

222 W. Hwy. 36 Cross Plains, Texas 76413

H A P P Y  H O L ID A Y S
*  S M A L L  B U S IN E S S  P E R S O N ! Da yaa need aipaaara m4 viaabHiry leek at ttta proparty 
Hwy 31 with away aptiaaa. Law Dawa Paywaat two or fwaaea.
*  L E T S  T A L K !  Savaral properties. 2 aed 3 BRa prapartlaa. 110,000 ta I ? " . 000 price range -  
Ownar financing.
*  IM M E D IA T E  O C C U P A N C Y !  Oaaatifal brick All amanititi of city, das# ia. Ownar* anx 
iom. at bar iataraxl netsidi araa.
*  R E D U C E D  A N D  O W N E R  C A R R Y !  3 B R , den, 1W bath, fenced com er lot. Fruit and
Pecan trees, storm  cd lar, and water welL __ _ _____________
*  P E A N U T  F A R M !  ftcaat Kttfa paaaat tana ia araa. 102 te n t with 10,000 lb paanut allot 
meat 3 BR.. wagia bath. Pee hie carper! 26x40 atop bldg.. 20x30 implement shad. 2 milea oat. 
Good financing. 6EW FEBCE.
*  B E A U T IF U L  Tree ahadad 100 x100' let wfbaak apa far haaaa or trailer, dauble carper!
*  6.19 A C R E S ,  4 milea eat Colemaa Highway. 0x12 storage, electricity hoek up Mica retreat. 
WiH trade for goad Ranger or Teyota Ackap.

C A LL  M E  TO  SELL  OR A P P R A IS E  YO U R  PRO PER T Y .  
FREE C O N S U L T A T IO N . FU LL -T IM E  B R O K ER .

( 8 1 7 ) 7 2 6 - 7 1 5 7  *.k



C.P. STUDENT REVIEW
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Basketball Up-Date
By WARREN PARSON

On Tuesday, December 10, Cross 
Plains was defeated by Jim Ned 58 to 
57 in a very intense game. With only 4 
minutes to play, we came from behind 
12 points. What a come back! Jim Ned 
has only lost one game.

On the following Friday night Cross 
Plains played the Abilene J.V. and 
were defeated 64 to 58. Abilene has an 
excellent ball team. Although we lost, 
this game gave us a chance to improve 
and learn from the experience.

Tuesday the Buffaloes traveled to 
Priddy and won 76 to 28. We only had 
eight players to suit up due to injuries 
and illness.

As of now, the Buffaloes’ record 
reflects 6 wins and 4 losses, which is 
not bad considering the level of com­
petition and all the road games.

Before district starts, we will have 
played in 20 games, and only 3 of 
them will be at home. Coach Boyd 
said, “ This is utterly ridiculous!”

We have two tournaments that will 
last throughout December. Our goal is 
not only to defeat our opponents, but 
to get better every time we set foot on 
the floor. Coach Boyd is proud of the 
guys and the whole basketball pro­
gram and its support.

At the time of this article the junior 
high boys remain undefeated.

Until next time, see ya in the gym.

City Council Minutes

Submitted by the 
Cross Plains City Council

December 3, 1991

This was a regular meeting of the 
Cross Plains City Council. Members 
present were Ted McKeehan, Edwin 
Weiss, Betty Lewis, Gary Childers, 
and Mayor Ross Gerking. Joe Holland 
was absent.

The meeting was called to order at 
6:30 p.m. Minutes of the last meeting 
were approved as read, Gary moving 
and Betty seconding.

First on the agenda was the letter 
received by City Hall from Coun­
cilman Joe Holland requesting a re­
fund for overcharges for copies made 
for city information. His request was 
for three (3) times the amount over­
charged. Edwin Weiss moved to table 
Joe Holland’s letter until city hall 
hears from TML and State Purchasing 
Agency in regard to the price of such 
copies. Gary Childers seconded and 
motion carried.

The Shelton property was discussed 
as to the clean up and when they would 
be through. Mark informed the counil 
that Mr. Shelton has called and in-

&
Political
Calendar

The Cross Plains Review is author­
ized to publish the following political 
announcements for the Callahan 
County office filings in the upcoming 
Democratic primary election set for
Tuesday, March 10,1991

For Callahan 
County Sheriff 
Eddie Curtis
Pol Adv. Pd. by Friends of Eddie Curtis, 040 Cherry Street, 
Baird, Tx. 79504

All political calendar advertising is 
payable in advance, at a cost of 
$80.00. A free press release and 
photograph will be published with
each announcement.

formed City Hall that he did intend to 
finish cleaning that lot as soon as 
possible. By general consent, the 
secretary is to notify Mr. Shelton that 
we would like it cleaned as soon as 
possible.

Betty Lewis read a letter received 
from City Auditor, James H. Cotter, 
in regard to a peer review of their ac­
counting and auditing practices. This 
letter will be placed on file. Edwin 
Weiss moved to pay bills. Gary 
Childers seconded and motion carried.

Christmas payroll compensation 
was discussed. It was pointed out that 
this expenditure was budgeted in 
March. Betty Lewis moved to look in­
to this matter to see if legal expen­
ditures exceed budget. Edwin Weiss 
seconded and motion carried.

Betty Lewis moved to adjourn. Ed­
win Weiss seconded and motion car­
ried. 7:40 p.m.

A Mosley Christmas
Charles and Dorothy Mosley of this 

city enjoyed having all their children 
in their home over the weekend. Sam 
Mosley of Anchorage, Alaska and his 
children, B.J. and Bridgette of Sun­
down; Jamey Mosley of Lubbock; 
Robert and Ranae Young of Snyder; 
and John and Rhonda Mosley of Ft. 
Hood, all arrived Friday evening, 
December 20.

Lots of reminiscing and good- 
natured ribbing was enjoyed by 
everyone. On Saturday everyone 
dressed up and went to Abilene and 
had a new family portrait made.

Sam treated everyone to hamburgers 
for lunch. Saturday evening Christmas 
gifts were exchanged and everyone en­
joyed a big Christmas dinner.

On Sunday most of the family at­
tended church services, and then 
everyone ate lunch at the Dairy 
Queen. Charles’ mother, Mildred 
Mosley, his sisters, Lugenia Mosley 
and Margaret Ochs, and Barry, Ben, 
and Vickie Mosley and Samantha, and 
Earl Mosley came over for the after­
noon. The household seemed very 
quite again after everyone left for 
home.

This was the first time all four 
Mosley children had been together 
with Charles and Dorothy at the same 
time in about four years, so it was in­
deed a very special time.

★  A ★
NEW YEAR’S EVE

Community Center Cross Plains
Comfortable Building — Tables And Chairs 
Set Ups Available — BYOB — Party Favors 

Black-eyed Peas At Midnight 
Good Music And Fun For All Ages

Band Starts 8 p.m. — Adm. $5.00 Per Person
Country Music By

BOB BURKS & WEST TEXAS WRANGLERS
Featuring Recording Artist
JOHN MORRIS

Resevations — 725-6870 — Leave Message On Tape 
Come Early — Stay Late — Everyone Welcome

PR’s
Friday Night Special

Small

5:30 p.m. -  10 p.m.
Fresh-W ater C atfish
. . . .  $4.95 Large...... $5.95

With All The Trimmings 
Homemade Desserts Available

To Go O rders Welcome -  Delivery in City Limits
CALL 725-6881

M pOoDAN 260 East 14th St. 
Owner AVAILABLE Cross Plains.Tx.

Jean Wilson

ROWDEN NEWS
By MRS. N.V. GIBBS

It’s hard to tell what the weather will 
be these days. Rain more than filled 
rain gauges this week. Vemie Belle 
Mauldin reported 6 indies for the 
week. The heavy fog Friday probably 
was a warning for folks to stay at 
home where the lights burned all day. 
For sure, the electric bill will be 
higher this month.

Hope all of you have had a Merry 
Christmas with family and friends. 
This special season is honoring the 
birth of our Saviour who was born and 
lived on earth, and was hung on a 
cross to die for our sins. Now, He 
lives again.

Edna Dye, and Bob and Kathy Dye 
had Christmas dinner with the Ed Dye 
family in Abilene Wednesday. Also, 
Bob and Kathy Dye were visitors of 
Mr. and Mrs. Skip Parker in Baird 
Friday night.

Visitors of Emma Johnson and Liz­
zie Burks during the week were Lee 
Ann Burleson and children of Abilene. 
Also, Tommy Burks and a son from 
Abilene and from Cross Cut, Mrs. 
Batts were visitors.

Claribel Gibbs visited Truitt and 
Lillian Hollingshead in Abilene Mon­
day. Lillian is the only living child of 
the late George and Josephine Miller,

r
HAPPY

: BIRTHDAY ;
v . . . . . ..................................

DECEMBER 27 
Mrs. Jack Little 
Mrs. Elmer Wilson 
Dickie Nowell 
Bobby Lawrence 
Dr. Mickey Bush 
Avis Sexton 
Barry Miles 
Norma Proctor

DECEMBER 28 
Tami Gwen Woody 
Brian Sibley 
Mrs. Katherine Swindle 
Marion Perry 
Mrs. Glen Vaughn 
Michael Ingram 
Mrs. Billy Paul Go Ison
C. A. Walker
Mrs. Pauline Region 
Karen Fletcher 
Mose Green

DECEMBER 29 
Dianne Hail 
Mrs. Earl Allen 
Johnnie Strickland 
Kenneth D. Brown 
Frances Knott 
Vicky Worley 
Michael Blake Foster 
Glenda Chandler
D. J. Roe 
Jacob Strickland

DECEMBER 30 
Kenneth Hopson 
Billy Gene Spoon 
Keith Hopson 
Carol Bates 
Eric Lovell 
Oddie Dawkins 
Mrs. Bob Dean 
Christopher Hamer 
Gertrude Johnson 
Royce Lawrence 
Wanda Jennings 
Milton Baty 
BUly King 
Lawrence S. Lee 
Joseph L. Hopkins 
Nancy Sheppard 
Don Edington 
Sambo Fleming

DECEMBER 31 
Kathy Denny 
Johnny Combs 
Eldon Gregg 
Mrs. Lela Foster 
Sam Hill 
Shirley Emmons 
Mrs. Norman Farr 
Danielle Webster 
Mrs. M.L. Foster 
George Randall Dickey 
Vicki Hickman Walker 
Billy Spoon 
Paul Golson

JANUARY 1 
Ted Souder 
Joyce Williams 
John Bagley 
Henry Wellmaker 
Charles Barr 
Ava Jones

JANUARY 2
Jessie Ray Harris
Leesa Higgin bottom
Jimmy Harris
Patsy Letney
Emma Jane Hobson
Leisa (Rayburn) Beauchamp
Cherilyn Fleming
Linda Reed
Cameron Cobb

who lived many years in the Rowden 
community. In Clyde a visit was en­
joyed with her aunt, Jewel Swanzy.

Judy Steele and her daughters, 
Tonya and Connie, were Christmas 
shopping in Abilene Saturday. Tonya 
is home for the holidays.

James and Dorothy Reynolds had all 
of their family here for Christmas din­
ner: Jim and Crecia Reynolds and son, 
Chris and Colby of Midland; Ellen 
Carpenter and son, Dalton of Azle; 
and Tan and Janet Flippin of Ruston. 
Louisiana and children. Drew and 
Erin.

Visitors of Joyce Odom this week 
were Ivon Odom of Stephenville and 
Charles and Nancy Palmer of Clyde.

The last week or so, all the beautiful 
Christmas cards began arriving. They 
get more meaningful each year. They 
will be cherished during this holiday 
season. May each of you have a Happy 
New Year in 1992.

(ROSS PLAINS

LIBRARY |
NOTES *

. . . . . . J

THE PIONEER 
PATCHWORK

By IRMA MILLER

The community received about 5 in­
ches of rain since Wednesday morn­
ing, with rain still falling and more in 
the forecast.

Jewel Foster’s son, Charles Foster 
of Clyde and his wife, Lucille, came to 
visit Jewel on Wednesday. Charles is 
gradually improving.

Lottie Sooter’s visitors last week 
were Mr. and Mrs. O.A. Dunn of 
Lubbock and her nephew and his wife, 
Roy and Sue Sooter of Albuquerque, 
New Mexico.

Frankie and Oliver Smith and Jean 
Fore were in Ranger Saturday visiting 
Frankie’s father.

Bill and Elaine Pancake furnished 
some music for the crowd at New 
Dimensions, a gathering place near 
Thrifty, and enjoyed the meeting 
there.

Brittany Michelle Jackson

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Jackson of 
Abilene would like to announce the 
birth of a daughter, Brittany Michelle, 
who arrived December 17. 1991 at 
Humana Hospital at 3:31 p.m. She 
weighed 8 pounds and 4 ounces and 
was 21 inches long.

She was welcomed by an older 
sister, 2 l/ i -year-old, Danielle Nicole.

Maternal grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. James Medford of Odessa.

Paternal grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. E.D. Jackson of Cross Plains.

Great-grandparents are R.H. Baber 
of Abilene, Mr. and Mrs. J.T. Med­
ford of Haskell, and Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Ward of Rising Star.

December 16 — 20, 1991

“ When I...discovered libraries, it 
was like having Christmas everyday. 
(Jean Fritz)

LAP: 30 children.
New Library Cards: Diane

Bowden, Megan Thomas. Charlie 
Bird. Kenneth Foller. Amy Andrews. 
Circulation: 143 

Cross Plains: 116 
Abilene Extension: 23 
Interlibrary Loan: 4 
The library will be open Monday. 

December 30. Happy Holidays!

Fast Results iir  
the Classified

Mrs. Suma Dill’s visitors last week 
were Erma Floyd, Allan Bland, all 
locally, and Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Dill 
and Jerry Dill of Kingsland.

Weekly Health Tip

DRINK WATER

Pure water (minerals yes. contaminants no) is the best 
health drink, and diet drink (no calories). Water is needed 
to keep the blood fluid, saliva and digestive juices flowing. 
Water flushes the kidneys, bladder and urinary tract to 
eliminate toxins and avoid infection. Water is an *anti- 

' wrinkle’ agent by keeping body cells fully hydrated. Six to 
eight glasses of water are considered necessary to replenish 
body fluids.

Vour better health Is our concern.• * • 0 •

NEAL DRUG
PH. 725-6424

iiiiiimiiiiiiiimnuiiimiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiriiiiiiirfi

6A.M. -  10P.M.
OPEN 7 DAYS-A-WEEK 
WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS Lakeway Grocery

LITTLE STORE — LITTLE PRICES

(817)725-7174 
CROSS PLAINS. TEXAS 

SUBJECT TO STOCK ON HAND

December 26th thru January 3rd
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