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Kiwanis Pancake 
Supper Tonight 

"Positive Action For 
Youth" Conference 

Challenging For 
Local Community 

By JACK SCOTT 
Former Review Editor 

An award of $1,000 to be used toward a 
college education awaits some Cross 
Plains High School boy or girl. 

That sum has been underwritten by 
John Gamradt, president of Dallas Digi-
tal Corporation, to honor the memory of 
the late Homer Robison, former local 
youth who at the time of his death was a 
budding star in the field of corporate 
achievement. 

Gamradt has specified that the financial 
grant will be available annually. Crite-
rion for aspiring applicants may be ob-
tained at the administration office in the 
local high school. 

The story of Robison, who was both a 
friend and executive serving under 
Gamradt, reads like a piece of pen of 
Horatio Alger, whose writings a genera-
tion or so ago motivated thousands of 
young Americans to aim high and strive 
diligently toward ambitious goals. 

Robison quarterbacked C.P.H.S. Buf-
faloes during their glory years of the 
fifties, graduating with the Class of 1955. 

The community of Cross Plains has 
long been in the lead on community in-
volvement and has taken the lead again 
by getting involved in community action 
planning. David Scott of WTU will be 
conducting an orientation into this pro-
gram March 11 at 5:30 p.m. at the Garden 
Club Center, sponsored by the local 
Chamber of Commerce. 

What is community action planning? Is 
it developing plans to lead Cross Plains 
into the year 2000? Setting goals estab-
lished by everyone in the community and 
provide the necessary direction Cross 
Plains is to take into the next century? All 
of this is correct. Every citizen of Cross 
Plains will have the opportunity to have 
their voice heard. 

Before any action can take place, there 
must be a plan in place. A plan agreed 
upon by the concerned citizens of Cross 
Plains. A plan with measurable actions 
and time limits. 

WTU has made available a Community 
Action Kit to develop a community ac-
tion plan. The plan will provide for how 
to ORGANIZE, EVALUATE YOUR 
STRENGTHS, DEVELOP DIREC-
TIONS, DEVELOP A BUSINESS 
PLAN FOR THE COMMUNITY, AND 
SET PRIORITIES. The beautiful part of 
the whole program is that the citizens of 
Cross Plains will make all the decisions 
for themselves, not outsiders to the  

He married a local girl (nee Patsy Parrish) 
and the young couple moved to Dallas. 
Both worked and studied in Texas insti-
tutions of higher learning. He became an 
outstanding business administrator and 
served tenures with Control Data Cor-
poration, Computer Product Sales and 
other industrial giants before joining 
Dallas Digital. At each location his as-
cension up the corporate ladder was 
meteoric. At the time of his passing in 
1991 he was general manager of Dallas 
Digital. 

Gambradt selected Cross Plains as the 
secondary school from which winners 
will be chosen at the suggestion of Mrs. 
Robison. It is possible that both he and 
she will be present at this year's com-
mencement exercises to participate in 
presentation of the prize. 

The Homer Robison Memorial Schol-
arship is believed to be the largest cash 
award ever offered to a local graduate. It 
is expected to be a stimulant for excel-
lence and fittingly honor the memory of 
the man for who.n it is named. 

community. Each person will have a 
voice, by ballot, as to the best direction 
for Cross Plains. This will take place at a 
town type meeting where all express their 
ideas. You all will enjoy the process and 
results. WTU will publish all the agreed 
upon action steps in a bound book and 
make it available to everyone. Upon 
completing of the tasks, WTU will 
present a plaque to the City of Cross 
Plains and a sign will be placed at the 
edge of town indicating that Cross Plains 
is an "Action Certified City." This title is 
nationally recognized by all major cor-
porations, industrial realtors, and eco-
nomic developers as a community that 
has passed the test to attract industrial 
jobs. The community has passed the 
livability test. 

Scott hopes to see you on March 11 for 
the Area Development meeting. 

Colonial Oaks 
Services 

United Pentecostal will conduct wor-
ship services at Colonial Oaks Nursing 
Home on Sunday, March 7, commencing 
at 3:30 p.m. 

The Kiwanis Pancake Supper will be 
held Thursday, March 4, from 5 to 7 p.m. 
at the Cross Plains School Cafeteria. 

Pancakes, sausage, tea, and coffee will 
be served. Adult tickets are $3 and chil- 

The Kiwanis club of Cross Plains is 
announcing their annual Farm Equip-
ment Consignment Sale to be held on 
Saturday, April 17. The location is 
changed this year to the Callahan County 
Livestock Barn on Highway 206 and a 
widely known auctioneer, Kevin Hutson 
of Sweetwater, will be conducting the 
sale. 

Incumbents, Rex Beggs and Monty 
Richards, have filed as candidates for the 
Cross Plains I.S.D. Board of Trustees. 
Two positions on the school board Fte 
expiring. 

Ray Purvis, a former councilman for the 
City of Cross Plains, has filed for elec- 

By CAROL ATCHLEY 

If any Junior or Senior is thinking about 
attending college or a technical school 
after graduating, then Cross Plains 
School Counselor, Ann Watson, en-
courages that student and his/her parents 
to attend a Financial Aid presentation to 
be held at the school. 

Barbara Callaway (Financial Aid Di-
rector at Cisco Junior College) will be 
presenting the program in the high school 
library at 6:30 p.m. on Monday, March 8. 

Any individual who is no longer en-
rolled in a Texas public school and who is 
interested in re-taking either the TAAS 
Reading, the TAAS Mathematics, or ei-
ther of the TEAMS tests may pick up a 
registration packet at the Cross Plains 
High School office. 

To be eligible to take either  of the tests, 
the registration form must be received (in 
the pre-addressed envelope) in Iowa 

The Athletic Boosters will meet 
Thursday, March 4, at 7 p.m. at the Dairy 
Queen. Items to be discussed are: fi-
nances, track meet, Pee Wee basketball. 
and the Athletic Banquet. 

dren under 6 years $2. 
All the proceeds of the event will ben-

efit the Children's Miracle Network 
Telethon as the annual fundraiser. 

Everyone is invited. 

Consignments are currently being ac-
cepted by calling Joe Hanke (night) 817-
725-6562 or (day) 817-725-6116; James 
Lawrence (day) 817-725-7216; or Henry 
Edington (night) 817-725-6227. 

In conjunction with, but an entirely 
separate activity, booth space for small 
vendors may be reserved by contacting 
Joy Gerking, 817-725-6861. 

tion, along with incumbent Gary 
Childers. Three council seats are avail-
able in the May 1 election. 

Candidates are reminded that Wednes-
day, March 17, is the final day to file for 
election. 

Planning to attend CJC is not necessary. 
This is to assist anyone interested in ap-
plying for financial aid. Mrs. Callaway 
will be glad to stay after the presentation 
to help anyone complete the forms. 

It will be necessary to have your com-
pleted 1992 tax forms with you, if you 
plan to complete the forms that evening. 
As the 1993-94 financial aid forms have 
changed again, Mrs. Callaway will have 
the most up-to-date information. Finan-
cial aid forms for this year's Seniors are 
now available. 

City, Iowa no later than 5 p.m. on April 
12, 1993. 

If you plan on taking any of the above 
tests, be sure to allow time to complete 
the forms and get it in the mail ill plenty 
of time. 

For additional information, contact 
Cross Plains School Counselor, Ann 
Watson, at (817) 725-6121. 

All members of the Booster Club and 
students of Cross Plains are urged to 
attend to make preparation for the Ath-
letic Banquet. 

By VANDA KING 
Editor 

The "PAY" Conference held at the 
Cross Plains High School was most en-
lightening, as a large cross section of 
community residents attended. Ann 
Watson, high school counselor, and her 
committee are to be applauded for pro-
viding personable, capable, interesting, 
and most importantly, informative 
speakers for the numerous sessions 
through Region XIV Education Service 
Center. 

In an attempt to not be repetitive, I will 
not list individual's names and subject 
matter, as they have already been intro-
duced in previous issues. I would like to 
highlight some of the most outstanding 
facts and ideas. 

The emphasis of family, school, and 
community cooperation for the best in-
terest of the youth was the main message. 
The suggestion that the youth should 
have an input into whatever projects 
might transpire from the conference was 
another plus. 

The statement that alcohol, a chemical 
substance, just like drugs, and nicotine, 
was repeated in each presentation. We 
were informed that ALCOHOL is the 
number one killer of teen-agers in Texas 
and the United States. One speaker ex-
plained the development of the human 
brain and the effects alcohol has on a 
teen-ager's brain, if drinking occurs dur-
ing the ages of 12 and 15. He stated that 
the front portion of the brain, which is the 
center for maturity, will never develop 
properly and that alcohol use inhibits 
learning at all ages. This statement alone 
notes attention. 
The presence of alcohol in the system 

also jeopardizes good judgment and 
sometimes leads to involvement in 
sexual activity. 

The session on sexually transmitted 
diseases was probably the most emo-
tional of all. You could hear weeping as 
we listened to the true facts about dis-
eases and its long term, and even terminal 
effects on the body. Sterility accompa-
nies certain diseases, and physical dis-
tress. 

Abstinence was the only recommen-
dation for both birth and disease control. 
All other methods were considered too 
risky. The virtue of abstinence should be 
a quality to be proud of, not ashamed. The 
need to carefully select a life time mar-
riage partner was given special attention. 

Parents were educated on liabilities 
they are responsible for concerning teens 
who drink and drive, or have been ar-
rested as a minor in possession. The fine 
and punishment for these offenses, plus 
those for contributing to a minor, are 
high. 
Self-esteem was another subject 

elaborated on, along with the signals of a 
child who is in trouble. Depression, sui-
cide, use of chemical substances, and 
other stressful events were discussed in 
detail. Mood swings, the most recogniz-
able symptom, along with limited family 
activities, a drop in grades, lack of at-
tention to physical appearance, and fail-
ure to participate in school activities are 
some of the signs. 
A speaker on the resilience of youth in 

the family was of particular interest. 
When a child has had a difficult home 
atmosphere, it has been proven that if 
there is only one healthy adult in their life 
they can become creative rather than 
destructive, 
The final session referred back to the 

original questions "So What?", "What 
Now?" At this point the entire group was 
asked to "brain storm" ways to attain a 
positive action for youth in Cross Plains. 
Divided into sections for school, civic 
groups, businesses, etc. ideas were pm- 

sented that could be feasible. Just a few 
that were mentioned included: more 
volunteer programs to connect youth and 
community; establishing Big Brother 
and Big Sister programs; recognition of 
more students through the school who 
excel in areas not already designated; 
provide other activities for the youth in 
the community; a community garden to 
be used for disruptive students and teens 
who have broken laws and are mandated 
to community service; and many more. 

The main purpose of the conference, 
that of bringing the community together 
to work for the best interests of its youth, 
was accomplished. Now the parents, 
school, and community need to continue 
this effort by following through on the 
many positive projects suggested that 
will help eliminate harmful and unac-
ceptable activities and emphasize those 
that will guide our youth in a positive, 
productive direction. 

USDA Commodities Distributed 

Central Texas Opportunities, Inc. will 
distribute USDA Commodities in Calla-
han County at the following locations: 

Baird: VTW, March 10, at 9:30 a.m. to 
11 a.m. 

Clyde: Senior Center, March 10, at 
1:30 p.m. to 2:30 p.m. 

Putnam: City Hall, March 10, at 11:30 
a.m. to 12 noon. 

Cross Plains: Multi-Purpose Center, 
March 11, at 8 a.m. to 10 a.m. 

Items available this month are rice, 
butter, and corn meal. 

C.T.O., Inc. has no control over what 
items are available or the quantity of the 
items. All locations of all commodities 
depends on the availability of food items 
from USDA. 

All eligible persons will receive emer-
gency food assistance without regard to 
race, color, age, national origin, political 
beliefs, religion, or handicap. 

Shut-ins are encouraged to designate an 
authorized representative to pick up for 
them. 

Volunteers are greatly needed and ap-
preciated to help with this much needed 
program. 

Local Law Seen 
Eating Dirt 

By PATRICIA COOK 
The offense was observed at a local 

eating establishment. A city officer by 
the name of Randy Pancake was spotted 
with a shovel and bucket filled with dirt 
(dirt cake that is) headed for a rather large 
circular object on his face. The suspect 
was the Dessert-of-the-Month winner for 
February, sponsored by the Alpha Rho 
Zeta Chapter of Beta Sigma Phi. 

When asked about the dessert, Randy 
replied, "Are these worms?" Laughter 
erupted from the coffee club sect at the 
Dairy Queen. Pancake was tried and 
found guilty of indulging in sweets. 

So concludes another case by this in-
vestigative reporter. 

Soldier Wants 
To Hear From 
Hometown 

Justin Whitsitt is currently serving with 
the U.S. Marine Corp and would like to 
hear from residents of his hometown, 
Cross Plains. He is a 1992 graduate of 
Cross Plains High School and the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Mitchell. 

You may contact him at the following 
address: 

Lance Corporal Justin 0. Whitsitt 
458-61-5517 
MATSG 
N A S LEMOORE, CALIFORNIA 

93246-5016. 

Community Action Planning 
Starts In Cross Plains 

Kiwanis Auction Upcoming 

3 More Filings 
In Local Elections 

Junior And Seniors... 
And Parents 

TAAS Or 
TEAMS Re-Tests 

Athletes And Members 
Encouraged To Meet 
With Athletic Boosters 
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TEXAS PRESS 
ASSOCIATION 

Food Plaza 
Now Featuring 
Quality Reverse 

Osmosis — Purified 
Water 

35c 
per gallon 

Bring Your Own Container 

PHILLIPS 

• 

Inclement Weather...Use Our 

DRIVE-UP 
WINDOW 

Our Drive—'Thai Window Hours: 

Monday thru Thursday 8:00 to 4:00 

Fridays open 8:00 until 5:00 p.m. 

THANK YOU 

FOR BANKING 

WITH US 

FOR YOUR BANKING CONVENIENCE 

P.O. Box 699 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443 

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK 

LENDER 
Phone (817) 725-6141 or 

725-6142 

Please !  

DON'T 
have new dentures made until you have 

your free denture consult with 

Dr. Easley 
203 Valley Forge 	 Comanche, Texas 

(915) 356-5263 	 (800) 452-1924 	• 

'horns 
12th & Main 	 Cross Plains 	 725-6117 

COME WORSHIP WITH US WHERE CHRIST IS HONORED 

Sunday Morning Bible Class........9:45 A.M. 	Wed. Morn'ng 
Sunday Morning WorshIp._........10:45 A.M. 	Ladies Biblo Class 
Sunday Evening Worship .............e:00 P.M. 	(Seasonal) 10:00 A.M. 
Wed. Evening Bible 	 P.M. 

. -Como now, and lat us reason together" Isiah 1:18 
Bob Pipes, Minister WE WELCOME ONE AND ALL 

LICc—a 	ei-f0Frei-T6 CHRIST 

BELIEVER'S`FELLOWSHIP 
Undenominational — Evangelical 

EAST HIGHWAY 36 Sunday School 	  9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	  10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship     6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday Night Family Bible Study 	  6:30 p.m. 

„ Bob Wallace, Pastor 725-6607 

 

Church Services 

 

PIONEER PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
LOCATED 5 MILES EAST OF CROSS PLAINS ON HIGHWAY 30 AND 1 PAGE NORTH ON FM III 

Sunday Morning Worship 	  10:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 	  6:30 p.m. 
Thursday Night Service     7:00 p.m. 

Ruby McCowen, Pastor 
Phone 725-7265 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
10TH & MAIN 	 CROSS PLAINS 	 (817) 725-7629 
Sunday School 	  9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	 MOO cm. 

	6:00 p.m. 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
North Main at George Scott 	 Cross Plains, Texas 

Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 	Morning Worship 	 10:45 a.m. 
SCRIPTURE —JOHN 3:1-17 

SERMON — A SECRET MEETING AT NIGHT 
Transportation Available — Call Jirmnlelee 725-7538 

Rev. Susan Trammell, Pastor 735-7377 

BIBLE CLASS 	  

UNITED PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
9TH & AVE. 

10:30 A.M. 

CROSS PLAINS 

WORSHIP SERVICE 	  9:30 A.M. 

Rev. Henry Grubbs, Pastor  

Everyone Welcome 
"....•••^•••••---•••••.- 

TEMPLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
... 

,,, Ave.:  . D.  . -:: .. . Cross . Plains.. 	. Texas ....... 7.   

• Phone

... 10:00 a.m. Su nCay School ...... 
Sunday Morning Worship .......................... 'I, ............... 11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evening .................................................... 6:30 p m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 	  7 
Steve Trussell, Pastor 	

:30ILM— 
725-7315 

Bible ii,fissionaTo America 
0111coBuildegat 1 110;tus wfay 	Taas7-841.711t7+725-7143 

owns mom s. fillselosay teacher 

SOUND TEACHING FOR GOD-FEARING FAMILIES 
.Esteeming Truth, Righteousness and the Gospel of 998C11 

.Diacipling beyond more empty religion Kali-4 
.Calling all to visible discipled obedience of the faith Bali 

Biblical - Conservative - Conclusive - Alive - Joyful 

/bad people la1:10-2 
 

Repcesenting the holy God Who effectively 	 

	

/ 	 • Sunday: Family Bible Teaching 10-1 1 3GA/A, 6:30-7:30RM 
Wednesdays: 6:30Plif ... 	 I 

	

) 	 ---  --..--- ___- . 	 _—__  —  _—• 

	

/ 
	ALL WELCOME & accepted on VA, merits. htt.7:1 2 

Church Training 	  
venIng Worship 	  7:00 p.m. 

Wed. Prayer Service 	  7:00 p.m. 
Michael Hale, Pastor — 725-7556 Scott Hamilton — MusicfYouth 725-7550 

0 

%OBITUARY 
2 — Cross Plains Review 

COUNTY COURT 
Bill Johnson, presiding 

Misdemeanor Filing 
Richard Dean Carroll, DWI 

Misdemeanor Minutes 
Kenneth Reagan Walker, probation 

revoked; sentenced to 30 days in jail. 
Motions filed to revoke probations on: 

Ronald Wilson, Henry Ernest Grant. 
Nelda Stewart, TPC, $10 fine $160 

court costs, 30 days in jail probated for 
1 year. 

Jamie Beruman, Jr., possession of 
marijuana, $300 fine $137 court costs, 
90 days in jail probated for 1 year. 

Atanacio Guerrero, DWI, $800 fine 
$192 court costs, 120 days in jail 
probated for 2 years. 

Robert Gomez Vasquez, DWI, $800 
fine $192 court costs, 120 days in jail 
probated for 2 years. 

NEW VEHICLES 
Eddie & Amy Hart, Clyde, Dodge 4 dr. 
Robert Harle, Baird, Chry Wgn. 
Terry Nazworth, Sweetwater, Dodge 2 

dr. 
Donald Lewis, Abilene, Jeep 4 dr. 
Stephen Lafferty, Abilene, Jeep 4 dr. 
Charles Jones, Rowlett, Chev Blazer. 
Martin Sprocket & Gear, Abilene, 

Chev Sub. 
Darwin Springstead, Abilene, GMC 

Housecar. 

CROSS PLAINS 
REVIEW 

(USPS 138-660) 
DON TABOR, PUBLISHER 
CROSS PLAINS REVIEW 

(USPS 138-660) 19 published 
weekly on Thursday for $12.00 
per year within Callahan County: 
$14.00 per year elsewhere In 
Texas; $16.00 per year out of 
state (No foreign copies except 
APO or like address); by Review 
Publishing Co., 155 E. 8th St., 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443. 
Second-Class postage paid at 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443. 
POSTMASTER: Send address 
changes to Cross Plains Review, 
P.O. Box 519, Cross Plains, 
Texas 76443. 
Telephone (817) 725-6111. 

March 4, 1993 

Robert & Phyllis Monde, Sweetwater, 
GMC Housecar. 

Rita Surran, Clyde, Jeep 4 dr. 
Herbert Meads, Avoca, Chev PU. 
Elvin Kinney, Rule, Dodge Wgn. 

42nd DISTRICT COURT 
John Weeks, presiding 

Civil Filings 
Divorces filed: 
Higgins, Paula Corn and Tommy Joe. 
Rose, Rita Gay & William Lawayne, 

and in the interest of minor children. 

Civil Minutes 
West, Charlie Lee and Kendra Mishea. 
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February 22 — 26, 1993 

Check out their recent arrivals. 
Donations: Mr. and Mrs. Charles 

Rodenberger, Jack and Kathryn Tunnel!, 
Clara Nell Spencer, Juanita Thornton, 
Janet Purvis, Ila Gilliam, Joan 
McCowen, Greenwood Insurance. 

New Books — Junior 
Fiction: 
"The Mozart Season" — Wolff 
"Aloha Means come Back" — Hoobler 
"Jay Hawker" — Beatty 
Non-Fiction: 
"A Desert Year" — Lerner 
"Animals in Danger" — Amos 
"Ryan White: My Own Stay" — White 
"American Tall Tales" — jsborne 
Circulation: 222 
C.P. & Extension: 219 
I.L. Loan: 3 

'Bob' Hodnett 
J.T. "Bob" Hodnett, 92, died Wednes-

day, February 24, 1993, in Round Rock. 
Services were held at 2 p.m. Saturday at 

First Baptist Church with Emerald Wray, 
Marvin Kemp and Michael Hale, all of-
ficiating. Burial was in Blake Cemetery, 
directed by Higginbotham Funeral 
Home. 
Mr. Hodnett was born in Brown 

County. He was the widower of Edna 
McCoy Hodnett, was a stock farmer and 
a member of First Baptist Church. 

Survivors include two daughters, 
Janice Faries of Austin and Faye Tucker 
of Lewisville; and a grandson, Richard 
Tucker. 

Billie J. Henry 
BAIRD — Billie J. Henry, 79, died 

Thursday, February 25,1993, at his home 
south of Baird. 

Services were held at 2 p.m. Saturday at 
First Baptist Church with the Rev. Ri-
chard Wood officiating. Burial was in 
Ross Cemetery Annex, directed by 
Parker Funeral Home. 

Mr. Henry was born and lived all of his 
life in Baird. He was a rancher and had 
served in World War II. 

Survivors include his wife, Goley 
Henry of Baird; four daughters, Dorothy 
Reynolds of Rowden, Barbara 
McKennon of Baird, Elaine Moore of 
Novice and Nancy Downey of Coleman; 
a sister, Loyce Loraine Griffin of Snyder, 
nine grandchildren; and five great-
grandchildren. 

Scott A. Miller 
ALAMOGORDO, NEW MEXICO 

— Scott A. Miller, 85, died Sunday, 
February 28, 1993, in Alamogordo. 

Services will be held Thursday, March  

4, at 2 p.m. at Higginbotharn's Chapel in 
Cross Plains. Burial will be in the Dressy 
Cemetery. 

Survivors include a son, Don S. Miller 
of Washington state; a daughter, Sherrill 
Roberts of Lubbock; a brother, James H. 
Miller of Las Vegas; two sisters, Pauline 
Mustain of Cross Plains and Adon Evans 
of Kerrville; six grandchildren; and five 
great-grandchildren. 

James L. Utley 
CLYDE — James L. Utley, 59, died 

Tuesday, February 23, 1993. 
Services were held at 4 p.m. at Aurora 

Cemetery in Wise Country (between 
Rhome Boyd, Texas), directed by Bailey 
Funeral Home. 

Utley was 1991-92 chairman of the 
Republican Party of Callahan County 
and a board member and past president of 
the Texas Dairy Queen Operators 
Council. He graduated from Texas 
Christian University, was on the Distin-
guished Alumni of Texas Weslyan Col-
lege and a member of First Methodist 
Church. 

He was born in Aurora in Wise County 
and lived in Fort Worth for 30 years 
before moving to Midland. Later, he 
moved to Clyde and, at one time, had 
been part-owner and operator of 51 Dairy 
Queens in West Texas. At the time of his 
death, he was owner-operator of the 
Colorado City Dairy Queen. 

Monday, the Texas Dairy Queen Op-
erators Council established the James 
Utley Helping Hand Award, to be given 
to a deserving member. At the same time, 
Barney Chapman, his partner in the West 
Texas DQ Association, established the 
James Utley Ranch Training Scholarship 
at TCU. 

Survivors include his wife, Jo Ann 
Bruner Utley of Clyde; two sons, Ken-
neth James Utley of Odessa and Stephen 
Paul Utley of Clyde; mother, Audrey 
S limp Utley of Fort Worth; a sister, Mary 
(Mrs. Howard L. Green of Fort Worth; 
and four grandchildren. 

Memorials may be made to the James 
Utley Ranch Management Program 
Scholarship at Texas Christian Univer-
sity, P.O. Box 30774, Fort Worth 76129, 
or to Cal Farley's Boys Ranch in Ama-
rillo. 

THE PIONEER 
PATCHWORK 

By IRMA MILLER 

The ladies of the Quilting Club worked 
on the Primrose and on the Fan on 
Tuesday. 

Jean Alexander and May Jones went to 
Clyde to visit with Jess and Berniece 
Pyeatt and talked about quilts on Friday 
afternoon. 

Nell Fleming's visitors were her sister, 
Vita and husband, Paul Pavlow of Corpus 
Christi; they spent a week with her. 

Frankie and Oliver Smith went to 
Ranger Wednesday to visit her daddy. 
Friday they, in company with Jean Fore, 
attended the Rising Star musical. Satur-
day the three went to Ranger again, and 
Saturday night to the musical at Echo. 

May and D.P. Jones received as guests 
Randy Wrobel and friend, Mary, both of 
Abilene, in the past week. 

Laverne and Cowan Hutton went to 
Temple Wednesday for a check-up. Fri-
day night and Saturday, Laverne at-
tended the PAY conference in Cross 
Plains. Sunday they visited with Jack and 
Freda Taylor of Cross Plains. On Mon-
day morning, Laverne, Sandy, and Tricia 
were quilting. 

Several Pioneer residents attended the 
AARP business luncheon in Cross Plains 
on Monday, including Jewel Foster, Jean 
Fore, and Irma and John Miller. 

OIL NEWS 
Callahan 

Ratex Energy Inc., Austin, 2 wells in the 
Parsons (Gray) 9 miles of Oplin in Sec-
tion, 142, Block 2, GH&H/H.A. 
Whorter, A-1651. They were: 

No. 2 Young, spots 938 FSL and 330 
FEL. Total depth 3,098 feet. 

No. 3 Young, spots 330 FSL and 1,415 
FEL. Total depth 3,250. 

Dry Holes 
Callahan 

R.E. Greene, Baird; No. 9 Greene 
Regular. Spots 1,350 FSL and 1,350 
FEL, Section 1, I&GN, A-66. Total depth 
680 feet. 

By PAUNIECE OGLESBY 

Millions of low-income families with 
children aren't claiming the special tax 
credits, worth up to S2,000, that they are 

'tied to. Many workers who miss out 
on this credit earn so little they had no tax 
withheld from their paychecks and were 
not required to file a return. Workers who 
lost their jobs or only worked part-time 
may be eligible for this credit. 

You may be eligible for this credit if you 
worked during the year, had at least one 
child, and your earned income was less 
than $20,000. 

Working families with wages between 
$6,000 and $13,000 can qualify for a 
credit of at least $1,000. There is also  

additional credit of up to $357 toi a child 
born in 1992 and another far help to buy 
health insurance. 

The Earned Income Credit was pro-
vided to give low-income parents an ex-
tra incentive for working and staying off 
welfare rolls. 

Earned Income Credit is the only credit 
that is refundable. That means it can go 
to a family whose income is so low that it 
owes no tax but can receive a refund 
check of up to $2,003. 

To find out more about Earned Income 
Credit, call the Cross Plains Multi-Pur-
pose Center (725-7698), Pauniece 
Oglesby (725-6772) or Irma Miller (725-
7696) to make an appointment with the 
AARP Tax-Aide Counselor. 

Special Tax Credit For 
Low-Income Families 

Alt 	N-Erws 
• Cewaleuatme 

I   
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their next trip. They personally want to Marilyn Cary, and Jacque Childress for 
thank Debra Childers, Terry Hunter, going with them. 

Free 
Income 
TaxService 

The monthly Texas Department of 
Health WIC and Immunization Clinic 
for Cross Plains has been cancelled, due 
to the reduction in manpower available 
for WIC. 

Immunizations are given each second 
Wednesday of every month from 8:30 
a.m. to 11:30 a.m. and 1:30 p.m. to 3:30 
p.m., and each fourth Wednesday of 
every month from 8:30 a.m. to 11:30 
a.m. at the Texas Department of Health 
Clinic, 1 1 1 Oak, Clyde, Texas. 

If you are interested in the WIC 
program, call the Clyde Clinic at (915) 
893-2125 for information and an 
appointment 
Prenatal care, family planning 

Services and well child check-ups are 
also available at the Clyde Clinic. 

mu seam im nue est% 

MINUTE 

j MUSINGS a 

By ESTHLOY S. DICKSON 

The weather is so 'dreadful' this morn-
ipg — I feel like just 'dumping' this col-
iimn. Then I'd wonder 'who missed it?' 
• Jimmiele,e Payne brought my Abilene 
paper up to the house early this morning 
— I appreciate his thoughtfulness. 

There were less than two hundred in our 
Sunday School at First Baptist on Sunday 
morning — the church attendance was 
better. The pastor's message was taken 
from Joshua 15. 

Bob and Sally Roady were in church 
Sunday morning. They visited Ms. Nettie 
at the nursing home nearly every day. 
They visited with Mr. Mac Childers in 
Cross Plains during the week. 
Betty Beggs visited with Novella 

Barton on Wednesday. 
Visiting during the week were Mrs. 

Rusty Beggs and daughter, Jaynell Jones 
and baby, Jordan. 

I planned to attend the AARP fleeting 
at noon Monday. 

Five courageous Moms met eighteen 
girls from Troop 215 in front of the 
school early Saturday morning. The 
group traveled to Brownwood to go 
skating, The first few minutes of skating 
were so much fun to watch. Several in the 
group hadn't been on skates in a while. 
Some hadn't skated in years. After a few 
bumps, falls, and crashes the group got 
down to some big time skating. The girls 
purchased Happy Birthday balloons and 
sang to Jacque Childress, who spent her 
birthday with us. The 5th and 6th grade 
girls won a free drink each for doing the 
Hokey Pokey the loudest and best. Ann 
Stephenson won a free drink for singing 
Achy Breaky Heart the loudest. 

After skating a couple of hours we went 
to the park for a sack lunch. The weather 
couldn't have been any better. The girls 
quickly ate, then played for the remainder 
of the hour before returning to skate for 
another two hours. 

Before returning home, the group had a 
pizza party at Mr. Gatti's. We arrived a 
little before they were ready for us, After 
devouring all the garlic bread, finishing 
off several pitchers of drinks, and ha-
rassing a few customers (who were ha-
rassing us), the pizza was ready. Every- 
one enjoyed the delicious pizza and the 
time we had visiting each other. We ar- 
rived back at Cross Plains right on time. 
Most everyone said they had a terrific 
time and couldn't wait until they take 

(Row 5), LeaJean Wyatt, Jessica 
Childers, Michelle Shields, Toni Mae 
Wyatt; (Row 6), Sharelynn Bell, Jacque 
Childress, Pam Hutton; and (NOT PIC-
TURED) Jennifer Turner, Kristen 
Hunter, Amber Wilson, Terry Hunter, 
and Marilyn Cary. 

JUNIOR TROOP 215 - (Row 1), 
Charlie Bell, Danyell Johnson, Kathryn 
McCarty; (Row 2), Ashlee Hutchins, 
Elizabeth Cary, Shannadon Black; (Row 
3) Ann Stephenson, Stephanie Beth 
Childress; (Row 4), JaDeana Nolan, 
Elizabeth McCarty, Brandy Hutton; 

By PAUNIECE OGLESBY 
Through the Tax-Aide program, volun-

teers provide free personal income tax 
assistance to the Senior Citizens, low 
income families, and the general public 
with basic tax returns. Individuals with 
complicated tax returns will be advised to 
seek professional tax assistance. 

Volunteers are specially trained in co-
operation with the U.S. Internal Revenue.  
Service (IRS), to understand those pro-
visions of the tax code that affect the 
Senior Citizen as well as the low and 
middle income people. Tax-Aide volun-
teers provide personal, one-on-one as-
sistance to help you complete your fed-
eral and/or state tax returns (including 
special rebate programs). 

Tax-Aide volunteers are available from 
February 1st to April 15th each year. 
There will be two volunteers working the 
Cross Plains area using the Multi-Pur-
pose Center on Fast 8th Street as their 
headquarters. Tax returns will be pre-
pared on Tuesday's from 8:30 a.m. to 2 
p.m. and by APPOINTMENT so you 
may be helped when needed. Volunteers 
are Pauniece Oglesby 725-6772 and Irma 
Miller 725-7696. 

When you need a Tax-Aide volunteer, 
you should bring the following: (1) a 
copy of last year's (1991) income tax 
return, (2) any W-2 forms you have re-
ceived (showing your income from 
working), (3) all 1099 forms you have 
received which show the interest and/or 
dividends, (4) all 1099-R forms which 
shows the Social Security paid to you, (5) 
form SSA-1099 which shows the Social CAR 

SALE 
Security paid to you, (6) records of any j 
other income you have received and (7) 
reeeipts or cancelled chechks for any 
medical/dental expenses and any contri-
butions you have made to charities. 

This is a community service available 
to those stated above and the Tax-Aide 
volunteers are eager to be of assistnace, 
so please call and le us help you. 

Delaney Dae Ames 
Tommy and Donna Ames of Odessa 

are proud to announce the arrival of their 
daughter, Delany Dae. She was born on 
December 5, 1992, weighing 7 pounds 
11 ounces and measuring 21 inches 
long. 

Grandparents are Tom and Sharon 
Ames and Bobby and Vickie Johnston 
of Cross Plains. 

Great-grandparents are Joyce Grahmn 
of Oklahoma, Ethyl Ames and Dan and 
Bobby Johnston of Cross Plains. 
The aunts are Jennifer Ames of 

Denton, Tracy Erwin of Plano and Lori 
Erwin of Cross Plains and one uncle 
James Ames of Cross Plains. 

Grant Andrew Jones 

Cliff's Texaco & Garage 
Introduces New Mechanic 

Grant Andrew Jones was born February 
18, 1993, in Seton Hospital, Austin, 
Texas. He weighed 8 pounds 15 ounces. 

Parents, are Steve and Luanne Jones of 
Pflugerville. Big sister is Leslie Ray. 

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. M.R. 
Womack of Cross Plains and Mrs. Mae 
Jones of Austin. Lillian Bryan of Lub-
bock is the maternal great-grandmother. 

$4,500" 
1986 CHEVROLET 

CAMERO 
67,500 miles 

stock no. 340C 

$5,8500° 
1986 CAPRICE 

CLASSIC 
:,BROUGHAM. _ 
59,450 miles, one owner 

stock no. 438C EDDIE JOE MARTIN 
(Formely of Montgomery Automotive) 

FOR YOUR FULL SERVICE AUTO NEEDS AND 
GENERAL MECHANIC CALL 

CLIFF KIRKHAM, JIMMY McNUTT or 
EDDIE JOE MARTIN 

(817)725-7445 
West Highway 36 	Cross Plains, Texas 

$6,55000  
GEO METRO 

PROGRAM CAR 
2 dr., 17,700 miles 

stock no. 445 

$8,97500 
1991 PONTIAC 

GRAND AM 
TC, power locks 
stock no. 453A 

Report Control 
Burns To Local 
Fire Department 
The Cross Plains Volunteer Fire De-

partment requests that area farmers and 
ranchers report control burns when 
scheduled. 

Notice of control burns will be helpful 
to the department. 

$4,99500 

1 9 8 5 OLDSMOBILE 
98 REGENCY 
BROUGHAM 

stock no. 493A 

41,250" 
1992 OLDSMOBILE 

CULTASS CIERA 
PROGRAM CAR 	• 
stock no. 599 

ROWDEN 
By MRS. N.V. GIBBS 

$8,7500° 
1989 CHEVROLET 

CAPRICE CLASSIC 
39,250 miles 

stock no. 175A 

$4,19500  
1986 VW 

JETTA 4 DR. 
80,000 miles stock no. 360A 

$4,5000° 
1989 CHEVROLET 
CORSICA SEDAN 

65,250 miles 
stock no. 597A 

$6,850.00 
1990 OLDSMOBILE 
CUTLASS CALAIS 

57,590 miles 
stock no. 606 

Full Meal Deal
x-Lb:Flungr-Buster*, Fries, 
16-oz. Drink and a Sundae 

$2,99500 
1981 DATSUN 

280 ZX 
clean car 

stock no. 569 

$7,250.00 
1991 CHEVROLET 

CAVALIER 
10,660 miles 
stock no. 605 

DO® Kids' Meal 
Fu.-1 len Motor Co. 
305 East Main • Eastland • 817/629.2676 

Call collect 817-629-2676. Open Monday • Friday 8 Eon, till 6 p.m., 
Closed Saturday and Sunday 

Your choice of a 
hamburger, hot dog or 
steak fingers. With fries, a drink 
and your choice of desserts. Plus a prize! 

On Sale March 1-14, 1993 
-Reg TM Am D 0 Corp 'Reg. TM Tx 0 0 Op. Coun 	D.0 

At participating Dairy Oucian 6tores 

IMl 

cHE-60Lia Of UMW 
Op Coun tyre-cooked weight 

Off and on weather has dotted this area 
this week. Some brush fires have also 
been seen this week, all in the Cross 
Plains area. Spring will be here after 
awhile. 

Ellen Carpenter of Azle and Janet 
Flippin of Nashville were here to attend 
the funeral of their grandfather, Billie 
Henry of Baird, Saturday. Jim Reynolds 
and family of Midland also were home. 
Billie was the father of Dorothy 
Reynolds of the Rowden community. 

Roland and Faye Mauldin visited Gene 
and Vernie Belle Mauldin Friday. 

Those from here attending the funeral 
of Lela Foster in Cross Plains Monday 
were Jessie Odom and Mike Odom, and 
Joyce Odom and Claribel Gibbs. 

Lee and Jean Jernigan of Lake Proctor 
spent last Sunday in the Tony Steele 
home. 

Joyce Odom had part of her family in 
her home last Sunday. Those present 
were Ginni Trevey of Snyder and her 
children, David, Scott, and Jennifer. 
They attended church in Cross Plains. 

Nell and Gundy Gunderson arrived 
Friday for an overnight visit with her 
sisters, Joyce Odom and Claribel Gibbs. 
They were enroute home to Minneapolis, 
Minnesota from McAllen where they 
spend the winters. Gundy will undergo 
back surgery in the near future. 

A nephew, Carroll Burks, visited 
Emma Johnson during the week. He re-
ported to Emma that he had a new 
grandson. Emma did not get his name. 
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C.P. STUDENT REVIEW! 

STUDENTS ENJOY TREAT —Not special. 
..being tardy last six weeks made them 

No Tardy Party 

1993 JUNIOR AND HIGH SCHOOL 
TRACK MEET SCHEDULE 

DAIS 

March 5, Friday 

March 12, Friday 

March 13, Sat, 

March 19, Friday 

March 20, Sat. 

March 26, Friday 

March 27, Sat. 

April 2, Friday 

April 3, Sat. 

April 8. Thursady 

April 9, Friday 

April 16, Friday 

April 23-24 
Fri-Sat 

April 30-May 1 
Fri-Sat 

May 7-8 
Fri-Sat 

May 14-15 
Fri-Sat 

ala 	TEAMS 

• Gorman 
	

HS/JH, B&G 

Cross Plains 	 JH B&G 

• Panther Creek 	HS, B&G 

Spring Break 

• Possum Kingdom Relay HS, G 

Dublin 
	

JH, B&G 

• Baird 
	

HS/ B&G 

• Eden 
	

HS, B&G 

• Gorman 
	

HS, G 

Dist 9A-Roscoe 
	

JH, B&G 

• Cisco 
	

HS, G 

• Dist 9A-Roscoe 
	

HS, B&G 

• Regional Qualifiers 

• Regional Meet. Abilene 

• State Qualifiers 

• State Meet, Austin 

Coaches: 
Monty Jones, JH/HS Boys 
Elaine Shedd, JH Girls 
Bill Boyd, HS Girls 

•Denotes High School Meets 

Enterprit-ses are in greatelit 
danger of failure at the 
beginning or near the goal. 
Shipwrecks occur near the 
shore. 

—Ludwig Borne 

C.P. HIGH STUDENTS OF THE 
MONTH OF FEBRUARY — Glenda 

Evans and Jared Harris. 

NO TARDY PARTY — The Cross 
Plains High School students enjoyed a 

By CA 

. At the end of the 5th six weeks the list 
was made and the students who managed 
to get to every class every day for the 
entire six weeks were rewarded for their 
efforts. 

Another trip to the Dairy Queen during 
homeroom was on the agenda. The 
middle school students went on 
Wednesday, February 24, and the high 
school on February 25. 

This six weeks, the middle school had 
43 — down slightly; and the high school 
had 48 — up slightly. 

Ashley D. Beggs 
Brandi M. Carouth 
Christopher L. Cary 
Jessica L. Childers 
Amanda G. Dillard 
Jolcna N. Fleming 
Amy S. Hale 
Chandra T. Heath 
Mastic M. Johnson 
David M. McGowcn 
Mindy M. Mitchell 
Ventura Monrrcal 
JaDeana D. Nolan 
Rcymundo Rcycs 
Jeremy L. Box 
R. Scott Brame 
Melissa K. Clark 
Barbara A. Evans 
Justin D. Hopkins 
Tanya S. Humphrey 
Kevin C. Nickerson 
Jeremy R. Pancake 
Morgan R. Pendleton 
Nathaniel J. Swift 
Carlton A. Thomas 
John L. Worsham 
Jeremy A. Barnett 
James R. Beaty 
Jason R. Carey 
John P. Chcsshir 
Donnie G. Childers 
Candice R. Eppard 
Becky A. Foster 
Amanda B. McGuire 
Adriana E. Montreal 
Brandi L. Monsey 
Constantino Reyes 
Justin C. Richey 
Malyssa A. Sowell 
Jason W. Tomlinson 
Lee W. Wheeler 
Chris R. Wood 

Freshmen 
Clayton Goble  

treat at Jack's Place as a reward for not 
being tardy all of last six weeks. 

Randy Hale 
Patricia Lee 
Jessica Warfield 
Donnie Dillard 
Todd Smith 
Jeff Key 
Jeff Parker 
Blake Foster 
Brock Walker 
Ben Honea 
Misty Abernathy 
Tiffany Free 
Willie Merryman 

14 
Sophomores 

Amber Williams 
Renee Atchley 
Regina Clark 
Terry Shults 
Cole Gilliam 
Chris Henson 

6 
Juniors 

Tamara Flippin 
Glenda Evans 
Josh Harrell 
Cody Winfrey 
Tim Yates 
Rodney Rudloff 
Tiffany McKenzie 
Heather Montgomery 
Jason Fleming 
Reneath Carouth 
Denese Whitely 
Coby Childers 
Eliz Davis 
Mark Trammell 
Billy Steams 
15 
Seniors 
Robbie Hutton 
Jacob Barron 
Trey Fortune 
Dustin Hinyard 
Sonya Renfro 
Randy Stephenson 
Rhonda Swift 
Gayle Upsion 
Jennifer Wheeler 
Charlotte Letney 
Corey Townson 
Bettina Gomillion 
Amy Welch 
13 

• • • 

Feti 111 IIS all stand pros-
tnother maul's. I mean. 

—Mark 'Twain 

SUCCESSFUL TENNIS TEAMS —
Rachelle Bishop (back, from left), 
Robbie Hutton, Tamara Hutton, Sheryl 
Glover, and Amber Williams; Brad 

By CAROL ATCHLEY 

It was a cold day two days, but the 
results were hot! Cross Plains was the 
only Class A school represented at the 
Breckenridge Tournament on Friday and 
Saturday, February 26 and 27, but they 
came away with several trophies. Other 
schools competing besides C.F. and 
Breckenridge were Albany, Eastland, 
and Ranger. 

According to Coach McConal, this was 
their first tournament of the year and they 
did an "outstanding job." Junior Rodney 
Rudloff took a first place in singles as did 
Senior Brad Morgan and partner fresh-
man Clayton Boble in doubles competi-
tion. 

The girls doubles team of Tamara 
Hiitton (soph.)--and Robbie Hutton (se-
nior) took second place. Sheryl Glover 
(soph.) made it to the consolation round 
but was defeated. Partners Jeff Brown 
(fresh.) and Cole Gilliam (soph.) took a 
4th place. 

Complete results are as follows: 
Boy Singles: 

Rodney Rudloff...1st place. Beat 
Ranger (8-3); beat Breckenridge (8-0); 
beat Breckenridge (7-5) (6-1); and beat 
Eastland (4-6) (7-5) (6-2) Champion-
ship. 

Cross Plains 
School 
Calendar 

Thursday, March 1 
Kiwanis Pancake Supper — Cafeteria. 

Friday, March 2 
Middle School Track Meet at Gorman 

and High School Track Meet at 4 p.m. 
High School Tennis Tournament —

here. 
Saturday, March 3 

High School Girls Track Meet at 
Goldthwaite. 

Tennis Tournament — here. 
Monday, March 8 

Financial Aid Presentation — High 
School Library, 6:30 p.m. 

Wednesday, March 10 
Computer network set up in Elemen-

tary. 
Thursday, March 11 

Early out 2 p.m. 
Computer network training. 
TAAS Exit Test grades 4, 8,10 (writing 

only).  

Morgan (front, from left), Rodney 
Rudloff, Cole Gilliam, and Clayton 
Goble. 

Girls Singles: 
Sheryl Glover lost to Breckenridge (5-
8); beat Breckenridge (8-2); and lost to 
Albany (2-6) (7-6) Consolation Finals. 

Boys Doubles: 
Brad Morgan/Clayton Goble: 1st place. 

Beat Albany (8-3); beat Ranger (6-1) (6-
2); beat Breckenridge (6-3) (6-3) 
Championship. 

Jeff Brown/Cole Gilliam: 4th place. 
Beat Ranger (8-2); beat Eastland (9-7); 
lost to Breckenridge (4-6) (2-6); and lost 
to Ranger (6-4) (4-6) (2-6). 

Girls Doubles: 
Robbie Hutton/Tamara Hutton...2nd 

place. Beat Eastland (8-2); beat Albany 
#2 (6-4) (1-6) (6-4); and lost to Albany #1 
(6-3) (4-6) (2-6). 

Rachelle Bishop/Amber Williams lost 
to Brecktidge (5-8); beat Breckenridge 
(8-3); and lost to Ranger (2-8). 

The C.P. Team will be competing in the 
Cross Plains Tournament this weekend, 
beginning Friday, March, and continuing 
Saturday. 

SCHOOL 

LUNCH MENU 
MARCH 8 — MARCH 12 

(SUBJECT TO CHANGE) 

BREAKFAST 
MONDAY — Bacon, egg, toast, 

jelly, grape juice, milk. 
TUESDAY — Buttered sweet rice, 

toast, orange juice, milk. 
WEDNESDAY — Pancake, sausage, 

grape juice, milk. 
THURSDAY — Ready to eat cereal, 

toast, orange juice, milk. 
FRIDAY — Cinnamon toast, grape 

juice, milk. 

LUNCH 

MONDAY — Burrito w/chili, cheese, 
spinach, crackers, diced pears, milk. 

TUESDAY — Steak fingers w/gravy, 
creamed potatoes, green peas, rolls, 
peach halves. 

WEDNESDAY — Tacos, corn, salad, 
Jello w/fruit, milk. 

THURSDAY — Spaghetti w/meat 
sauce, salad, garlic rolls, fruit cocktail. 

FRIDAY — Hamburger, lettuce, to-
mato, pickles, French fries, peanut butter 
cup, milk. 

Jean Wilson 
Owner 

Tennis Teams Score Big 
In Breckenridge 

PK's  
Friday Night Special 

5:30 p.m. — 10 p.m. 

Fresh-Water Catfish 
Small 	 $4.95 	 Large 	 $5.95 

With All The Trimmings 
Homemade Desserts Available 

To Ge Orders Welcome — Delivery is City Limits 
CALL 72S-1181 
MEXICAN 

FOOD 
AVAILABLE 

260 East 14th St. 
Cross Plains, Tx. 

C.P. MIDDLE SCHOOL STUDENT Jarad Richards. 
OF THE MONTH OF FEBRUARY— 

Students Of 
The Month 

By CA 

For the month of February, the Cross 
Plains High School teachers selected 
Glenda Evans, a junior, and Jarad Harris, 
a sophomore, as "Students of the Month." 

Glenda is the daughter of Mary and 
Norma Evans. Over the last three years in 
high school, Glenda has been involved in 
a variety of activities including Annual 
Staff 1 year, basketball 3 years, track and 
band 3 years. Teachers that selected 
Glenda had such comments as, "Out-
standing leadership, very cordial, is in-
volved in many activities yet maintains 
good grades, honest, and dependable. 

Jared is the son of Pam and Jimmy 
Harris. As a freshman and sophomore, 
Jared has been involved in both basket-
ball and football. Jared received corn- 

ments from teachers such as "he tries 
hard, well-mannered, achieves pretty 
much what he is capable of achieving, 
hard working, on time, always pleasant, 
and good all-around attitude. 

Their pictures were on display in the 
high school outside the principal's office 
during the month of February. 

On display outside of the Elementary 
and Middle School office dating Febru-
ary and representing the *Middle School 
was 7th grader, Jarad Richards. Jarad is 
the son of Monty and Melissa Richards. 

Jarad, as a 7th grader, was involved in 
football, basketball, track, and was se-
lected by the teachers because they say he 
is a good student in class, consistently 
works hard, and always strives to do 
better. 

f 

A a 



IN MEMORY OF PATSY CLINE-- years ago, but whose music will live 
Who was killed in an airplane crash 30 through her avid fans. 

We love you, 
Dusty, Tommy, 
Patti, Denise, 
and Charles 

Food Plaza 
Weekly Deli Special 

Any purchase from our 
Deli entitles you to 

participate in a weekly 
drawing for a FREE 8-piece 

CHICKEN DINNER. 

Come On Down And Try Some! 

aosTRIVALKIVITH.Jzsus 
REVIVAL 

MARCH 7, 81 AND 9 
6:30 P.M. 

UNITED METHODIST CHu 
025T 	 11 11  
PREACHER: REV. JOHN LUKERT 
SONG LEADER: REV. DON ROATH 

"I- 111.11••••••••1111••••11.11111111111 

Area Residents Named 
To Honor Roll At TSTC 

and K-Trina S. Pickard of Cross Plains 
TSTC-WACO — Hubert K. Hanke are listed on the President's Honor Roll 

for the Fall quarter at Texas State Tech-
nical College Waco (TSTC Waco). 

Hanke, a student in the Biomedical 
Equipment Technology program, is the 
husband of Clara F. Hanke. 

Pickard, a student in the Avionics 
Technology Program, is the daughter of 
Beth Meador. 

The President's Honor Roll recognizes 
the scholastic achievement of students 
with a grade point average of 4.0. 

The largest residential technical college 
in the nation, TSTC Waco offers over 40 
exemplary instructional programs rang-
ing from advanced manufacturing in 
electronics and laser electro-optics to 
aerospace and information technologies. 

For over 25 years, the Texas State 
Technical College Waco has accepted 
the challenge and responsibility to edu-
cate and train quality technicians for 
Texas and the nation. These "world 
class" technicians have moved into the 
workforce enabling Texas to more ef-
fectively compete in a global economy. 

For more information concerning 
Texas State Technical College Waco, 
call the Admissions and Records Office 
toll free at 1-800-792-8784. 

STEPHENVILLE — The A and B 
Honor Roll and Distinguished Student 
list for the Fall 1992 semester has been 
announced at Tarleton State University. 
Dr. Robert C. Fain, Vice President of 
Academic Affairs at the University, re-
leased the names of students honored 
during the fall semester which ended in 
December. Incuded on the list were 254 
students making the A Honor Roll and 
969 making the B Honor Roll. There 
were 986 Distinguished Students named. 

Students listed on the A Honor Roll 
must have a 4.0 grade point ratio (GPR) 
on the 4.0 system and be taking a mini-
mum of 12 hours. Students on the B 
Honor Roll must have a grade point ratio 
between 3.00 and 3.99 with no grade 
lower than B and taking a minimum of 12 
hours. 

Distinguished Students include fresh-
men and sophomore students who have a 
minimum GPR of 3.25 with no grade 
lower than C, and juniors and seniors 
who have a minimum GPR of 3.50 with 
no grade lower than C and are in good 
standing. 

Known locally who were among the 
elite listing are: 

James Roger — A, D 
David Stalcup — B, D 
Michael Franke — B, D 
Kyle Foster — B 
Deana Conlee — B 
Shelley Horan — B 
Donna Herridge — B 

By CALVIN CHAMPION 

While driving down the highway, your 
hand is constantly active, pushing but-
tons or turning knobs on your radio. As 
you skim rapidly through the channels, 
the slow, spine-chilling piano music and 
warm, emotional lyrics of a country 
music classic catches your attention. As 
you indulge yourself into the lyrics of 
"Crazy," you realin- that this love song 
has some aura about it that captivates 
your most inner feelings. You pull your 
car over and just for a moment you lose 
yourself in these sweet, relaxing memo-
ries of yesterday... 

Hymns, honky tonk tunes, love and pop 
songs — these are four styles of songs 
that Grand Ole' Opry legend Patsy Cline 
excelled in during her brief but prolific 
singing career. 

During the early years of her career, and 
while under her first contract with Decca 
Records, Patsy Cline recorded a string of 
standard hymns. Soft melodies, pro-
nounced piano music, and her raw, 
emotional voice can be heard in such 
tunes as "Just a Closer Walk With Thee," 
"Life's Railway to Heaven," and "Dear 
God." These songs, easily recognizable 
by their content as being affiliated with 
God and the church, gave the consuming 
public a chance to hear what the music 
industry knew would be a star of tomor-
row. Although the listeners in radioland 
liked what they heard, it was not until this 
inspirational entertainer began recording 
honky tonk tunes that she began to ex-
perience celebritism. 

Upbeat tempos, multiple types of jam-
ming guitars, and booming drums are just 
a handful of characteristics pertaining to 
the honky tonk tunes Patsy Cline popu-
larized in late 1959. Songs such as "Bill 
Bailey," and "Write Me in Care of the 
Blues" became bar and dance floor fa-
vorites due to their jitterbug, swinging 
beats. Also, with characteristics like 
growling and yodeling added by this in-
ventive performer to songs such as 
"Lovesick Blues" and "There He Goes." 
There was nothing left to decide about 
her musical future. It was clear that this 
singing sensation was well on her way to 
superstardom. 

In 1961, with the release of her number 
one Billboard chart smash, "I Fall to 
Pieces," it was evident that Patsy Cline 
had a voice which was made to sing love 
songs. Slow beats, smooth tones, and 
flawless emotional filled lyrics create an  

atmosphere that set the mood of those 
dark, hole-in-the-wall nightclubs of the 
1960's. Whether she is singing about 
blossoming romance like "True Love" or 
crying heartaches in "Crazy" and "Faded 
Love," the singer who experienced ten-
der emotions such as these had found a 
style of song that mixed with her deep, 
gifted voice ripped at one's heart.. Love 
songs like these, which describe the true 
lives of many listeners, had the momen-
tum to begin pushing Patsy Cline over the 
top of the country charts and onto the pop 
charts. 

The piercing sounds of violins fade into 
audibility followed by a repetition of 
softly caressed piano keys, then a voice 
that sends chill bumps up your spine —
and the tone is set for Patsy Cline's most 
often recognized pop song, "Sweet 
Dreams (of You)." Songs like this 
which have a wide selection of musical 
instruments including orchestras and vo-
cal groups, create a style in country music 
that had not been seen before. "Someday 
You'll Want Me to Want You," "Does 
Your Heart Beat For Me," and "Always," 
all recorded by Country Music 
Association's Entertainer of the Year in 
February 1963, set a new standard in 
country music that a country performer 
did not have to stay with one limited 
style. Dubbed the "Uptown Country 
Singer," and described as having the 
voice of an angel, Patsy Cline had found 
national acclaim in the pop field and on 
the pop charts. Not only had she been the 
first country performer to headline in Las 
Vegas and New York City, but due to her 
pop hits, had also become the biggest 
attraction at the Grand Ole' Opry: all of 
this accomplished in her short life of 
thirty years. 
Today, Patsy Cline albums sell to the 

tune of 750,000 yearly and her "Greatest 
Hits" album was certified triple platinum 
(actual sales surpass 3.5 million). Her 
changes in style and her "angelic" voice 
are what brought a new generation of 
listeners into the Nashville sound. Al-
though it has been thirty years since this 
gift of God was stolen from us in a tragic 

Today, Patsy Cline albums sell to the 
tune of 750,000 yearly and her "Greatest 
Hits" album was certified triple platinum 
(actual sales surpass 3.5 million). Her 
changes in style and her and her "angelic" 
voice are what brought a new generation 
of listeners into the Nashville sound. 
Although it has been thirty years since 
this gift of God was stolen from us in a 

The Alpha Rho Zeta Chapter of Beta 
Sigma Phi met Monday, February 22, in 
Wanda Merryman's home. 

A very interesting and informative 
program was presented by R'Evelyn 
Childers. Her program was "Do only 
weird people from school? Or the 5 W's 
of Home Schooling." The five W's were 
Who, Where, When, What, and Why. 
She stated that (Who) anyone can teach at 
home — high school dropouts to doc tors; 
(Where) home schools are all over the 
world; (When) They have been around 
since the beginning of time; (What) They 
teach the children spirit, soul and body, 
character and value training, one on one 
teaching of the basics and positive so-
cialization; and (Why) home school is 
less restrictive, more time for home life, 

Water Meeting 
Set For March 22 

The annual meeting for all Callahan 
County WSC members is scheduled for 
March 22, 1993 at 7:30 p.m. in the 
District Courtroom, 3rd floor, County 
Courthouse at Baird, Texas. The 
following agenda items will be 
addressed at this meeting: 

1. The nomination and elections of 
incoming directors. 

2. Report by Jon Herod CPA, 
Financial and Audit Reports. 

3. Engineering Report - Jacobs & 
Marling Engineering 

4. Board of Directors Report - Robert 
Warren, President. 

5. FmHA Report - Maxyves E. 
Verzele, Asst. District Director, Philip 
C. Madeley, District Director. 

6. Report on Texas Rural Water 
Association Annual Meeting, March 
10-13 in Austin - Curtis Watson, 
Director CCWSC 

All members are requested to attend 
this meeting. 

Board of Directors C.C.W.S.C. 
Robert Warren, President 

tragic plane crash, she still captivates 
audiences of all ages today through a 
magical aura that surrounds her eternal 
mystique. 

Biographical information: 
Real Name: Virginia Patterson Hensley 
Born: September 8, 1932, Gore, Vir-

ginia 
Died: March 5, 1963, Camden, Ten-

nessee 
Selected Songs: "I Fall to Pieces" #1 
W/Chart Position: "She's Got You" #1; 

"Walking After Midnight #2"; "Crazy" 
#2; "Sweet Dreams (of You)" #5; "Faded 
Love" #7; "Leaving on Your Mind" #8 

Female Vocalist of the Year 1957, 
1961, 1962, 1963 

Entertainer of the Year 1962, 1963 
Country Music Hall of Fame 1973 
Feature film biography "Sweet 

= 
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OSTRICH, EMU, RHEA: The most lucrative invest-
ment of the 90s? American Specialty Investments 
accepting subscriptions for our spring investment 
fund. Our last fund earned 65% in one monthl For 
details write; P.O. Box 43121, Austin, TX 78745. 

DIRECTOR OF PHARMACY: Ward Memo Hos- 
pprrttaalI 	TX. Texas pharmacist license req. 
Excellent Benefits. PrernierPhamiacy, 3636 Ex-
ecutive Center Dr. 1200, Austin, Texas 78731.512-
346-3506. 

3 WEEK PROGRAM, job placement before train-
irg, financing available. Call Tri-State semi driver 
training: Austin: 512-442-7364, El Paso: 915-598-
5523, Beaumont: 409-898-0707, Fort Worth: 817-
581-9196, Dallas: 214-709-8294, Garland: 214-
226-7666, Denton: 817-566-6180, Houston: 713-
591-7630. 

TRUCK DRIVERS • $1,000 sign-on bonus for safe 
drivers w/6 mo. OTR exp. Up to 30t7mi. +20/mi. 
MPG bonus. Compare our benefits to other Co.'s I 
New programs avail for teems_ Corn Trans, Inc, 
Exp. - 1-800-234-1553, inexp. 1-800-759-6993. 
Dept AY - 58. 

OTR DRIVERS TIRED of tie same old garbage? 
Want to drive a nice tractor? Work with good people 
and get good benefits? Cell 1-800-888- 7015 E01. 

CANDY VENDING ROUTE: Distributing company 
of major candy products seeks individual to service 
established accounts, Investment $3K to $17K. 
Short hours. Great P/1 or FTT. 1-900-727-9081. 

THE TEXAS COURTHOUSE revisited, by June 
Rayfield Welch, has photos of all 254 courthouses. 
Autographed. $29.95. Yellow Rose Press, Box 
140221, Irving, Texas 75014 for details. 

WE BUY NOTES secured by real estate. Have you 
sold property and financed the sale for the buyer? 
Turn your rote into cash, 1-800-969-1200. 

GOT A CAMPGROUND mem boars h ip co timeshare? 
We'll take it America's most successful resort re-
sale clearin9 house. Call Resort Sale information 
toll free hotline 1-800-423-5967. 

HAPPY JACK REAGARD: Patented electronic 

lots of field trips, time to pursue the 
interest of the child and strengthens the 
family ties. 

A short business meeting was held after 
the program. A report of Miss Valentine 
program and also the upcoming cook-
book was discussed. 

Secret Sister gifts were presented and 
delicious refreshments were served. 

Everyone enjoyed a time of visiting 
with each other. 

Twelve McMurry 
Students Traveled 
To Louisiana To 
Help Victims Of 
Hurricane Andrew 

ABILENE, Texas — Twelve Mc-
Murry University students will be among 
the 41 from the Abilene District of the 
Northwest Texas Annual Conference of 
the United Methodist Church who trav-
eled to Baldwin, Louisiana to help vic-
tims of Hurricane Andrew. 

Joining Rev. Johnnie Kahl, minister to 
the university, was Wes Brown, junior 
from Cross Plains, Texas; Charlene 
Boswell, junior from El Paso; Russell 
Gravitt, freshman from Levelland, 
Texas; Jordan Grey, junior from Here-
ford, Texas; Jeff McCormick, senior 
from Albuquerque, New Mexico; Aaron 
McFatride, freshman from McKinney, 
Texas; Rebecca Ramey, freshman from 
Hermleigh, Texas; Joaquin Rueda, 
freshman from El Paso; Clcssie Thomas, 
freshman from Lawton, Oklahoma; 
Donald Ward, sophomore from Dallas; 
Elaine White, junior from Friona, Texas; 
and, Larie Wright, sophomore from 
Crowell, Texas. 

Kahl said the group departed from 
Abilene at 6 a.m. Wednesday, February 
17, and returned to Abilene on Sunday, 
February 21. The group primarily re-
placed tin roofs on homes damaged in the 
hurricane that struck parts of the Gulf 
Coast in September. 

McMurry University, a four-year lib-
eral arts institution which opened its 
doors in 1923, is located in Abilene, 
Texas. Owned and operated by the 
Northwest Texas and New Mexico 
Conferences of the United Methodist 
Church, McMurry has an average en-
rollment of 1,500 students from diverse 
heritages and backgrounds. Forty-two 
majors and eight pre-professional se-
quences are offered through seven bac-
calaureate programs. 

McMurry welcomes the application for 
admission, and for financial assistance, 
of all qualified students regardless of sex, 
age, race, color, national origin, religion, 
or handicap. Contact the Office of Ad-
missions at 1-800-477-0077; in Abilene, 
call 691-6402. 

Dreams" released 1985 
Recording Academy Hall of Fame 1992 
"Greatest Hits" album certified triple 

platinum 1992 

Dick and Mickie Dillard are back after 
three weeks and two days. We missed 
them every day, but they were sight-
seeing and visiting with Dick's sister in 
Ramonsville. They went to Corpus 
Christi. I know they enjoyed it so much. 

We are sorry Fay Jackson sprained her 
wrist; glad it's better now. 

We enjoy the Wednesdays when some 
of us gather around the piano and organ to 
play and sing. It's so nice to see Suma and 
her son, Fred Dill, com ing to the Center to 
eat with us. I see she enjoys playing 
dominoes with Hazel and A.B. 

Welcome again to Bransford and Eloise 
Eubanks, Lucile Callaway, Doris and 
Andrew Walker from Burkett, Shirley 
Weingarten, Merlin Franke, Bessie 
Maddox, Mabel Halsell, and Charles 
Rodenberger. 

Some seniors play pool. Wouldn't it be 
nice if they could have tournaments? 
Some play dominoes, Chicken Foot, 
Skip Bo, Rummy Cube, Forkle, and 
Friday mornings Bingo. 

Come on out and enjoy the good food 
and fellowship. Some of us ladies are 
submitting recipes to the cookbook the 
United Methodist Church is putting to-
gether. It was so nice of them to ask. We 
know it will be a good one. 

Well, until next week, God Bless. 

Senior 
Citizens 

Stats 
By MARIE HORTON 
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Sorority Met Feb. 22 

TSU Students 
Announced 

Many Styles Of A Legend 

Statewide Classified 	Advertising Network 
Advertise in 300 Texas newspapers for only $250. 

Reach 3 MILLION Texans. Call this newspaper for detallq 

device controls fleas in homes without pesticides. 
Results overnight At TSC Stores. 

FOR SALE: 1/2 acre in downtown historic district 
of Comfort, Texas. 3,800 square feet of fireproof 
buildings space. 210-995-3854 or 210-995-3659. 

160 ACRES, SCEMC West Texas. Canyons, In-
dian caves, river access. Views Mexico moun-
tains. Muledeer, Quail, Javelins. $1,000idown. 
$140/month TX-Vet (7.99%-30yrs) 210-792-4432. 

DANISH BOY 17, anxiously awaiting host tamely. 
Enjoys sports, computers. Other Scandinavian, 
European high school students arriving August 
Call 	or 812-467-4619 or 1-800-SIBLING. 

BECOME A PARALEGAL Jcin America's fastest 
growing profession. Lawyer instructed home study. 
The finest paralegal program available. P.C.D.I., 
Atlanta, Georgia. Free catalogue. 1-800-362-7070 
Dept. LC722. 

BECOME A VETERINARY assistant/animal care 
specialist Home study. Turn your love of animals 
into an exciting career. Free fact-filled literature. 1-
800-362-7070 Dept CC722 

MOBILE HOSES WANTED-. Have all cash, will 
pay top price, maybe a Rae more. You call,  IS 
come wok_ Please call today. i -600-743-7731. 

HERSHEY'S DiSTFIIBUTORSHP: National manu-
facturing and distributing company seeks qualified 
local individual to service established route. No 
selling - restock displays and earn excellent in-
come part time, full time. Training, equipments, 
established exotica. Minim um investment $4-k to 
$12k, call novel Harold 1-800-940-2299. 

WOLFF TANNING BEDS new commercial-home 
units from $199. Lamps, lotions, accessories. 
Monthly payments low as $18. Call today. Free 
new color catalog. 1-800-462-9197. 

ADOPTIOft OODLES OF hugs and piggy-back 
rides await your precOus baby. Financially secure, 
stay-at-home morn. Nurtilring, devoted and long-
ing to them beautiful home. Love and laughter. 
Call Nide collect 212-534-2316. Its illegal to be 
Feld b.  gybing *end legal/medical expenses_ 



BUSINESS SERVICES 

CARPET CLEANING, REPAIRED, 
RESTRETCHED — New and used 

carpet sold and installed. Scotch 
Guarding Available. NO CHARGE 
FOR FURNITURE MOVING OR 
ESTIMATE. (817) 725-7720 Dub 
Meador. 23-TFC  
NEED YOUR HOME CLEANED? 
— Call Karen (817) 725-6856 after 
3:00. Good references. 49-1TC 

PREVENTING SUICIDE 
Suicide is the 3rd leading cause of death among 

children and the second leading cause of death 
among older teens. A recent University of 
Pittsburgh conference revealed that extreme 
anxiety--described as fear and dread--is emerging 
as a key trigger to suicide in the young. Dr. 
David Brent identified contributing factors: 
substance abuse, behavior disorders, previous 

. attempts or a family history of these. Kids who 
.i, talk, don't do it... so talk with your kids, show 
' them you care! 

NO-Urbeitei health Is our concern.'  ... 

NE/11, 1)111;17 
PH. 725-6424 
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[RISING STAR AUCTION COMPANY 
2-DAY AUCTION WEEKEND - MARCH 6TH & 7TH 

WEST HWY. 36 --DOWNTOWN RISING STAR 
SATURDAY MARCH 6TH 11:00 TOOLS & OUTDOOR RELATED ITEMS: 
Antique & Collectible: beirdriven drill presses; Ford wrenches; barbed cowyokes; scales; nice variety had tools; 
cast !for' hotplate, Keystone Railroad Tool Grinder; fly rod; Keen Kunst' hatchet; gate chain and more. 
Power Tools: Jigsaws: SkilsaYs; sanders: drilts; gem tumbler; tlexdrhe grinder, stapler and more. 
Hand Tools: verbus hand tools; fence stretcher; boomers; chains; pipe wrenches; planes; new per brushes; 
capers; axes; machetes; grease guns and more. 
Learn I Garden Equipment: chain saw; shovels. rake; hoe posithob diggers; edgers and more. 
Miscellaneous: 110V Fadden arc; washer 6 dryer; shop fan; 7000 lb. lack; house lacks; steel barber:We pit; shop 
desk; bullhorn; canvas tent; canvas tarp; mobile home levelers; tool boxes; car farms & Sick stands; telephones: 
boxes of misc. and moms. 

SUNDAY MARCH 7TH, 1:30 ANTIQUES 6 COLLECTABLES: 
Furniture: OA curb cabinet; leaded glass front curio cabinet; oak drop front desk re/glass bookcase ends; OA tall 
boy; chittrobe; 6 wardrobes; sideboard; dressers; drum table; Firestone cabinet radio; ireadie sewing machine, OA 
end table, various other cone. & end tables; childe fumhure; wicker and more. 
Collects Wes: PoGostIck. Merry-Go-Round;Smiley Pig pitcher;McCoy 117515;Brush1681;(2)8 day mantel clocks; 
fountain pens; Briggs I Striation clock; toys; 1964 Chevy yardstick; cap guns ; felt pennants:18 pc. gold plated goblet 
set wtwoodsn case; brass doll bed; Tarot cards; costume leweiry; crock; tire; coachman's horn; tokens; 56 pc. NSP 
chins; Aladdin lamp; blue Mason jars; cookie tars and much more. 
Glassware: 25 pc. Norttake; 17 pc. Westmoreland; 10 pc. Viking Smith; Fenton; Lennox; amethytaNehlte cased 
glass; depression glass including pink looted pitcher; amethyst & black amethyst cobalt blue; pitcher colectort an 
glass including a large down, several unusal bud vases and much more. 

Preview of Sunday's sale on Saturday 
Concessions Available Inside 

BI-RITE AUTO 
Phone (817) 725-7361 	 4 Blocks E. Of Light 

CROSS PLAINS, TEXAS 76443 

1978 FORD F-250 4 dr. Crew Cab 460 V8, auto, new paint, new 
Interior 	 $2,450 
1964 CHEV. SUBURBAN Diesel In very excellent cond. two- 
Ions blue 1st class all the way, dual air 	 $4,250 
1977 CHEV. SUBURBAN, 454 V8, dual air, two-tone yellow, 
Meador looks new. Super good cond. Trailer towing package 
	 $3,250 

1996 PONTIAC PARISIENNE BROUGHAM 4 dr. sedan, dark 
meow and very nice 	 $2,950 
(2)1967 FORD CROWN VICTORIAS 4 dr. sedans In good cond. 
	 $2,595 each 

19115 V.W. JETTA 4 dr. diesel, very good cond. Air, 5 spd. Looks 
and nits great, 45-50 M.P.G. 	 $2,450 
196111UNCOLN TOWN CAR In excellent cond. (white). Go 1st 
class for only 	 $4,750 
1964 LINCOLN TOWN CAR Signature Series In good cond. 
(blue) 	 $3,475 
1980 CHEV. EL CAMINO In fair cond. Looks good. 	$1,550 

RISING STAR 
NURSING CENTER 
Has Vacancies Available For 

Both Male And Female 
Residents 

Private Or Semi-Private Rooms 
Are Available 

- - 	- ----- 
Call (817)643-26910r Come By 
And Visit At 411 South Miller 

In Rising Star 	49-tfr 

ANTIQUES — 9-piece dining room 

suite, $2,800; marble top dry sink, $375; 
miscellaneous antiques. JACKSON'S 
HOME FURNISHING, (915) 784-

7102. 49-1TC 

CARD Of THANKS 

CARD OF THANKS 
To all who expressed sympathy for the 

lost of our father, we thank you. The 
cards, food and words of kindness ment 
more than you know. Thank you. 

The family of 
J. T. (Bob) Hodnett, Jr. 

Centurion Operating Corporation, 
P.O. Box 3099, Early, Texas 76803, has 
applied to the Railroad Commission of 
Texas for permits to inject fluid into a 
formation which is productive of oil or 
gas. 
The applicant proposed to inject fluid 

into the Cross Cut Sand, on the follow-
ing leases and wells; North Half 160, 
Well #2; H40E, Well #2 and Well #4; 
Eastflank 1, Well #2; Eastflank 4, Well 
#1 and Well #2; Eastflank 5, Well #1; 
andEastflank 8, Well #1. The proposed 
Injection Wells are located five miles 
northeast of Cross Cut in the Brown 
County Regular Field. Fluid will be in-
jected into strata in the subsurface depth 
interval from 616 to 621. 
LEGAL AUTHORITY: Chapter 27 

of the Texas Water Code, as amended, 
Title 3 of the Natural Resources Code, 
as amended, and Statewide Rules of the 
Oil and Gas Division of the Railroad 
Commission of Texas. 

Requests for a public hearing from 
persons who can show they are ad-
versely affected, or requests for further 
information concerning any aspects of 
the application should be submitted in 
writing, within fifteen days of publica-
tion, to the Underground Injection Con-
trol Section, Oil and Gas Division, Rail-
road Commission of Texas, Drawer 
12967, Capitol Station, Austin, Texas 
78711 (Telephone 512/463-6790). 
49-TC 

	) 
TAKE OVER — 40 acres ranchland. 
No down $35/ mo. No credit checks. 
Great Hunting. Owner financing. (818) 
831-1764. 49-2TP 

THERE IS STILL A 
DIFFERENCE AT FOOD PLAZA 

We are Interested In hiring persons who pos-
sess the following qualities: Personal Integrity 
& Dependability. Willingness To Work & Con-
tribute To A Progressive Organization. An 
Ability To Work In A Fast Pacod Work Envi-
ronment_ An Outgoing Personality With An 
Eagerness To Serve The Public. Personal 
Schedulo Flexibility. Personal Phone Number. 
H10 Srd-ool Diploma or Equivalent. 
Insurance Now Available For Full-Time Em-
ployees. If You Feel You Meet All Of These 
Criteria., Please Apply AL 
Your Fsiod Plaza in Cross Plains or Call 725-
6179 (Drug Screening Roquired). 

_doreisw_ooleis._,•erseP/rdise...""k  

Cross Plains 
Business Service 

Income
Forms 

Tax Returns 
W-2rm 1099's
Typing Bookkeeping Copies 

916 N. Main St. 
Cross Plains 	(817) 725-77212r  
Julene Franke,  Owner/Operator r  

I All STAR I 
AUTO SALES 1  • (ACROSS EitaIN DAIRY QUEEN) 

HWY 36 CROSS PLAINS, TEXAS 

I 	 I 
1 1985 CHEROKEE 4X4....$3,850. 1 
1 1979 DATSUN 280Z.......$1,250 1 
1 1975 DATSUN 280Z. 	$3,000 1 
1 1982 FORD ESCORT......$1,800 1 
1 1981 FORD 4X4 PICK-UP.$2,150 1 
11981 SUZUKI, Low kmzs...$950. 

I 	 I 
I CALL FOR INFORMATION I 

(817) 725-7311 OR 725-7176 I 
"WE SELL CLEAN AUTOS" I 

TRADE/BUY/SELL 
CONSIGNMENTS 

4.4.44.***se s p Ec [AL 440444.44.44m 

1987 BUICK RIVERIA 
1 	$5400.00 	I 

I  FOREIGN CARS & 	 92  ABILENE, TX.79603 I 

.214 N,LEGGETT 	 915-672-4064 	1.1  
MI mom( in as. IN mai El NI 1111 In NI MIN so so no Eli um so so 

I  We Specialize In 	915., 077-2 4  

LUXURY CARS 	24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE I  

iiiam No NE or am ow aim NI IN um us a non NI am mg 
EXPERT BODY WORK AND PAINTING 

BARRETT 'BODY SHOP it 
I 	CLAUDE CHAMPION, OWNER 	1 

CROSS PLAINS 
MEDICAL CENTER 

902 N. MAIN 
OPEN MONDAY-FRIDAY 

8:30 A.M. — 5 P.M. 

(817) 725-7106 

BUSINESS & 
PROFESSIONAL 

DIRECTORY 

Ross L. Jones 
Attorney At Law 

Open Each Wed. 
9 a.m. — Noon 

9th & Main 
(Old Dal-Mar Bldg.) 

(817) 725-6747 
Coleman: 	(915) 625-2146 

17-th. 

Mediplex Home 

Health Care 

Services 

(817) 72$-7132 

912 North Main 
Cross Plains, Texas 

Russell Surles 
Abstract Co. 

Prompt & Dependable 
Abstract Service! 

337 Market Street 
Baird, Texas 

Charles Walker, Owner 

Susan J. Schaefer 
C.P.A.  

Accounting & Tax 
Service 	. 
9th & Main 
Cross Plains 

Phone: 725-6747 

CROSS PLAINS 
BUSINESS 
SERVICE , 

Bookkeeping and Tar 
Service 

Affiliated with TAPA 
916 N. Main 

(817) 725-7712 

REGISTERED 
PROFESSIONAL 

LAND SUr1VEYOR 
JOHN D. BURLESON 

-BOX 365 	CROSS PLAINS 

817 725-6485 

4 
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C & C ENTERPRISE 
BENNY CALLAWAY 

18171 726-6200 or 
(817! 725-7545 

DRAIN & SEWEIts  
REPAIR- 

PLUMBING REPAIR 

JONES REAL ESTATE 

79.41 Acres, $32,000. 
79.40 Acres, Good Hunting, 

$30,000. 
3 BR., 1 Bath near school. Lots of 

trees, $18,000. REDUCED TO 
$15,500 

2 Bdrrn., 1 bath, near Community 
Center, GOOD BUY, $16,000. 

5 room home in Cisco, nice w/ 
many extras, $17,000. 

Mobile Home on 2 acres, 3 bed-
room, 2 bath, fireplace, large car-
port, barn and pens. Good buy! 
$16,000. 

JOHNNIE BLAND 
(817) 725-6293 

ROLAN JONES 
(817) 725-7640 

Cross Plains, Tx. 
49-TFC 

• 1 

SPRING TURKEY LEASE —
Wanted for 92-93 Season. Call 1 (713) 
585-0334 ask for Mike, or wite to Mike 
Coppenger, 4935 Charnock, Alvin, 
Texas 77511. 49-41T 

.4411444•1444,11101M4.41•4446a 	 

FOR YOUR MARY KAY 
PRODUCTS 

Call Sandra McCarty 
(817) 643-7787 

I' 	 

HERBALIFE 
DIET MAGIC 

Imse 30 lbs. in 30 
Days for $30 

ALL NATURAL! 
Connie's Cuts & Curls 

(817) 725-6318 
Velma Carr 
817 725 7 

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS 
NEW AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPMENT 
LILUSTONAMC 

PLANTERS-OISKS-DNIVI 
ROWSE CULTIVATORS 

CHISELS 
SRI ON TRADE 

CLARK TRACTOR & SUPPLY, INC. 

DELEON — (817) 893-2061 ' 
COMANCHE — (915) 356-2593 

WHERE YOUR BUSINESS 
IS APPRECIATED 

DORA SMIT- H 
Real Estate Broker 

(817) 725-6489 
* 2 br., 1 bath lovely remodled 
home on 2.3 ac. edge of town, 
trees, water, central heat. Extras 
— call today! 
* 20 ac. S. of Cross Plains, trees, 
grass, utilities, ATTENTION 
TEXAS VETS! $15,000. 
* 3 br., 11/2 	'iobrick, garage, 
Cen. H/A, 	, fenced yard, 
great location. 
* 22 ac., 
3. UNDER CV.." ZIross Plains, 

* Spacious house, extra den, din-
ing, 11/2  baths, garage, storage, on 
large corner lot near school and 
town. 
* 2 br.. I bath, very well built 
home, with 5 lots on highway 36, 
close in. Great for residential/com-
mercial. 
* 1 1/2  lots in town. 
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ANNOUNCEMENTS 	) 

CONSIGNMENT FARM AUC-
TION — south of Clyde. To get you 
consigments in next weeks consign-
ment list. Call (915) 854-5663. 
49-1TC 

Auctioneer 
Danny Koonce 

Tx. Lic. # 10874 

Fast:Results in 
the  Classified7:7_  

INCOME TAX 
SERVICE 

Accounting & Tax Service 
713 Ave A. 

Cross Plains, TX 76443 

. Mon.-Thurs 	8:30 a.m.-5:30 p.m. 

Friday 	 8:30 a.m.-Noon 

Zella Erwin 

(817) 725-61564,  

206 W. College 
Rising Star, TX 76471 
817-643-7321 

r\_ 
	FOR RENT 

FOR RENT— Two bedroom house 
and three bedroom house, both HUD 
approved. For further information call 
(817) 725-6205. 49-1TC 

FOR SALE 

FOR SALE — Queen size box spring 
and foam .nattress, $40.00, call (817) 
725-6442.49-ITC  
ROUND HOUSE Denim Overalls —

size 32-50, $18.99. Johnson's Dry 
Goods, Cross Plains, (817) 725-6211. 
49-1TCD  
BLUE CHAMBRAY WORK 
SHIRTS — Long sleeves, two pockets 
w/flaps, permanent press, $9.99. John-
son Dry Goods, Cross Plains, (817) 725-
6211. 49-1TCD  
FOR SALE — 21 foot John Deere drill, 
21 foot tandem disk. Call (817) 624-
5274. 49-1TC  
NEED KITCHEN CABINETS? —
Nice, varnished, solid maple, low price, 
cannot be beat, Call (915) 692-0670, 
241 Air Base Rd., Tye, Tx. 79563. 
46-4TPD  
FOR YOUR MARY KAY PROD-
UCTS call Pauniece Oglesby, (817) 
725-6772. Have all Mary Kay Cosmet-
ics line in stock — ladies and men's skin 
care, body and fragrance items. Free 
delivery, Gift Wrapping. 11-TFC  
MONUMENTS AND MEMORIALS 
Cliff Kirkham is agent for Riley-Gar-
dener Monument Service of Hamilton, 
Texas for the Cross Plains area. Contact 
Cliff Kirkham for complete information 
on quality monuments. Call (817) 725-
6500. 11-TFC  
JACKSON'S HOME FURNISHING 
— 9 1/2 miles north of Brownwood on 
Highway 279. New and used — Living 
Room, Bedroom, and Dining Room 
Suits; miscellaneous antiques. Tuesday 
— Saturday 10-6, Sunday 12-6. (915) 
784-7102. 46-4TC  
BONNIE'S STAINED GLASS & 
SPORTS CARDS — is carrying new 
gift items and Potpourri, pies, wood-
working and ceramics, and quiltings. 
West Hwy. 36. 49-1TC 

FURNITURE 

SPECIAL BUYS — Loveseat sleeper, 
$399; Queen floral, pillow/back, $535. 
JACKSON'S HOME FURNISH-
INGS, (915) 784-7102. 49-1TC  
SALE SPECIALS — All rockers, re-
cliners, and mirrows 20% off. 
JACKSON'S HOME FURNISH-
INGS, (915) 784-7102.49-1TC 

COLONIAL OAKS NURSING 
HOME — Is now taking applications 
for an R.N. Director of Nurses and a 7-
3 weekend R.N. relief. Competitive 
wages will be offered. Contact Frances 
Wolf at (817) 725-6175. 29-TFC 

INCOME TAX 
ACCURATE-AFFORDABLE 

35 Years Experience 
In Professional 

Tax Work 

JON E. HARDWICK 
C.P.A. 

Highway 80 West 
Baird, TX 

1915) 854.1256 
42 car 

: 	  ( 
LEGAL  NOTICE 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR 
FLUID INJECTION 

WELL PERMIT 

REAL ESTATE 

LARGE HOUSE FOR SALE — 1 
acre, 4 bedrooms, 2 baths, large den, 
fruit trees. 5 miles northeast of Cross 
Plains. (817) 725-7572, Roy Richey 
place. 40-TFC  
FOR SALE — Two bedroom, on bath 
prick house, central heat pump on large 
lot. Call (817) 725-6227 after 5 p.m. and 
weekends. 48-2TC  
FOR SALE OR TRADE — 3 bed-
room, large bath, garage on 1 acre, 
Cottonwood. (817) 725 6322 or (817) 
725-6619. 49-TFC  
FOR SALE — 4 bedroom, 1 1/2 bath, 
on 100 ft. x 100 ft. lot, East 9th and 
Beech, contact Doug or Nelda Weiss 
(817) 725-6677. 49-1TC  
GET OUT OF THE CITY — 10.5 
acres, I 1 1/2 miles north of Cross Plains, 
County Rd. 458; improvements, pas-
ture. Call (915) 677-1811, (915) 690-
1500, (800) 588-1811 or FAX # (915) 
672-1222 after 5 p.m. 49-4TP 

	• 
HELP WANTED  ) , 	•  

 

GIVE AWAY — Free puppies. 
Wymeramer and Shepherd Sheep Dog. 
Call (817) 725-6429 or (817) 725-6819. 
49-1TC 

7 
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By LINDA EDINGTON 
Activity Director 

We had a fine group of singers last week 
at our Wednesday morning sing-a-long. 
We do so appreciate these folks for taking 
the time to come and brighten up the 
residents' day with music. Special thanks 
to Wayne and Wilda Dennis, Clyde 
Linker, Vernie McMillan, Sally Roady, 
Frankie Smith, Ozella Huddleston, and 
Ruby McCowen. 

Our appreciation to Monte Pau lk for the 
good lasagna; Ruby Cassle for the candy; 
beautiful flower arrangements given in 
memory ofJ.T. Hodnett; and Pete Golson 
for the snacks; and the Disabled Ameri-
can Veterans for the house shoes. 

Dee Dee Edins, Evelyn Hard from San 
Angelo, Jerry and Macy Wilson, and 
Earlene Hughes from Baird were here 
visiting Lillian Smith. 

Sally Roady visited Nettie Roady. 
Elva Nell and Garland Dupriest, James 

Goble, Jr. from Rankin, Connie and 
Nikki Griffeth from Noodle, Jami and 
Sharon Lewis from Midland, and Roy 
Neil and Ellawayne Tatom of Atwell all 
visited with Valerie Rouse. 

Charlene Metcalf visited Clara Coburn. 
Peggy Koenig visited Ruth Joy, Bertha 

Wheeler, Zenovia Strickland, and Nettie 
Clark. Also visiting were Farrell Ste-
phens and Mary Bates. 

Uva Jones of Cottonwood and Bob, 
Cookie, and Brian Robinson from Clyde 
visited Nettie Clark. 

Zora DeBusk from Burkett visited with 
Lola Patton and Clara Coburn. 

Beverly Brown from Cottonwood vis-
ited Mildred Ford and Bertha Wheeler. 

Joan Pope from Stephenville visited 
Lizzie Burks. 

Bonnie Hedrick visits daily with Julia 
Hedrick. - 

Activities during the week: 
Monday — Bingo winners were 

Estelle Breeding, Clara Coburn (2), Ruth 
Joy, Mildred Ford, Zenovia Strickland, 
Dorothy Thomas, Vera Belyeu, Midge 
McCall, and Lucille Stone. Exercise 
class. 

Tuesday — Art class. Dominoes and 
popcorn. 
Wednesday — Sing-a-long with 

Wayne and Wilda Dennis, Clyde Linker, 
Vemie McMillan, Sally Roady, Frankie 
Smith, Ozella Huddleston, and Ruby 
McCowen. Exercise class. 
Thursday — Linen folding with 

Rohni, Rachel, and R'Evelyn Childers. 
Games. 

Friday — Bingo winners were Lucille 
Stone (2), Ruth Joy, Dorothy Thomas, 
Midge McCall, Slyvia Smith, Ressa 
Glover, Mildred Ford (2), Vera Belyeu, 
Zeonvia Strickland, and Bertha Wheeler. 
Afternoon singing with Sister Ruby and 
Bobby Jack McCowen. 

Sunday — Church service with Pio-
neer Baptist. 
The world is blessed most by people 

who do things and not by those who talk 
about the. 

1992 Donations To 
Cottonwood Fire 
Control Told 
Cottonwood Volunteer Fire Control 

would like to take this opportunity to say 
thank you to the folks that have supported 
them faithfully with their donations. 
These people play a big part in keeping 
CVFC operating. The volunteers truly 
appreciate each and every one of them. 

Those that have made donations in 
1992 are as follows: Rowden Commu-
nity Center; Forrest Scott; Mr. and Mrs. 
John Purvis; Lucille Hall; Mr. and Mrs. 
Wendell Smith; Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Rodenberger; Mr. and Mrs. Turner 
Simpson; Vondal and Joyce Hutchins, 
J.Y. and Bea Simpson; Callahan County 
Insurance Association; Robert and Do-
rothy Watson; W.F. and Pat Moore; Mrs. 
H.H. Lofland; Hogan Lofland; Mr. and 
Mrs. R.E. Green; Marjorie Middleton; 
and several that wish to remain anony-
mous. 

By JANICE BUCKNER 

That's "the way it was" when Barbara 
McKoy hosted Ladies Day recently at 
Lakewood Recreation Center. 

After a short business meeting and de-
lectable luncheon, members and guests 
chose to play either golf or bridge. There 
were prizes and favors galore. 

The big winner was LaNell Henry who 
was elected president, won the door 

Salvation is a condition, or state, in 
which a person who has heard, believed 
and obeyed the Gospel of Christ, is in. 

The Holy Spirit is a divine person, the 
third person in the diety — (Godhead)). 
There is God the Father, God the Son, and 
God the Holy Spirit. The Holy Spirit is 
called comforter (John 14:16) Jesus said 
he would pray the Father, and he shall 
give you another comforter. Even the 
spirit of truth. John 16:13 says Howbeit 
when He the spirit of truth is come, he 
will guide you into all truth. 

The Gospel of Christ is the power of 
God unto salvation Rom. 1:16, 17. That 
is to those who hear it, and believe it, and 
obey it. Heb. 5:8,9 

When folks hear and truly believe it, 
that person will obey it just as stated in 
Rom. 6:16,17,18) Obedience to the 
Gospel is when a person is saved. Titus 
1:11, 12 

It is an erronious idea for anyone to 
think they have received the Baptism of 
the Holy Spirit as the Apostles were en-
dued with the Holy Spirit and spoke as the 
spirit gave them utterence. If the Holy 
Spirit was telling folks what to say now, 
what need would they have for a new 
testament? The Apostles had the power 
to perform miracles just as did Jesus. No 
human being can perform a miracle now 
as did Jesus and the Apostles. 

When folks believe and obey what is 
written in the New Testament, they be-
come new creatures. 2 Cor. 5:17 — In-
stead of having a sinful nature, they then 
have a spirit that is holy, a new attitude, 
disposition, and character. That is what 
happens when a person is born again as 
Jesus stated in John 3:1-8. The Holy 
Spirit through his word of truth creates a 
spirit in folks that is holy when they truly 
believe his word. 

The three persons in the Godhead. The 
three are spirit beings. They dwell in 
Christmas through the word. If they 
dwelt personally in folks persinally, that 
would be incarnation. When Jesus was on 
earth that was a case of incarnation. No 
other person is equal to Jesus Christ. 

And no person on earth can perform 
miracles like Jesus performed them. The 
Apostles performed miracles, they were 
able to even raise the dead. 

The New Testament is a complete rev-
elation of God's Truth unto the human 
family. Nothing is lacking. The Holy 
Spirit guided the Apostles in teach the 
whole truth. Jesus told the Apostles that 
he would send the Holy Spirit unto them, 
and He (the Holy Spirit) would guide 
them unto all truth. (John 16:13) and the 
Apostle Paul plainly states that all 
scriptures are given by inspiration of 
God, and is profitable for doctrine, for 
reproof, for correction, for instructions in 
righteousness: That the man of God may 
be perfect, thoroughly furnished unto all 
good works. (2 Tim. 3:16, 17) and Peter's 
statement in (2 Pet.. 1:3). 

In the early age of the Lord's church 
there were apostles., God used them for 
the purpose revealing divine revelation 
unto the human family, God endued 
them with the power to perform miracles. 
That power given to them was necessary 
for the conformation of the divine truth 
they taught But that supernatural power 
was not to continue always. (See 1 Cor. 
13:8-10). 

Paul plainly states that prophecies 
would fail. Meaning that it would be 
reduced to inactivity. And he m; ant that 
prophecy given by supernatural power. 
The word "Fail" is from the word 
Katergeo. And the same is true con-
cerning speaking tongues by supernatu-
ral power. Also Paul said knowledge 
would vanish away. And he is speaking 
of knowledge that came by inspiration. 
He did not mean knowledge that comes 
by study. 

It is an inexcusable mistake for any 
person to each that folks now have the 
same power that the Apostles had. No 
human being has the power to raise the 
dead. Neither is there a person on earth 
that can speak a language (tongue) that he 
has not learned by study, or by associa-
tion with folks who speak that language. 
I realize that a person can get sc excited 
about something they will jabber like a 
baby who has not yet learned to speak 
words. But that does not mean that the 
Holy Spirit is causing them to jabber. 

prize, and was second at bridge. Barbara 
McKoy was the bridge winner and 
Juakana Scott won "the traveling deuce" 
prize. (We're not telling who took home 
the low score prize.) 

Officers elected were: President —
LaNell Henry; Vice-President —
Frankie Smith; Secretary — Doris 
Grider; Treasurer — Juakana Scott; and 
Reporter — Janice Buckner. 

And about Paul receiving the Holy 
Spirit three days after he was saved, Acts. 
13:9 does not say that. It says, "Then 
Saul, (who also is called Paul). Filled 
with the Holy Spirit, set his eyes on him 
(Elymas) Paul received the Holy Spirit 
when he obeyed the Gospel. 

God had a special use for the man who 
came to be known as Paul the Apostle. 

About Paul going to Ephesus recorded 
in Acts. 19. Paul met about twelve men 

who had been Disciples of John, and Paul 
asked them if they had received the Holy 
Spirit since ye believed? And they an-
swered, we have not so much heard 
whether there be any Holy Spirit. Then 
Paul said that John Baptized with the 
Baptism of repentance, saying they 
would believe on him which should come 
after him, that is on Christ Jesus. When 
they heard this, they were Baptized in the 
name of the Lord Jesus. And when Paul 
laid hands upon them; the Holy Spirit 
came on them and they spake with 
tongues, and prophesied. 

And the men were about twelve. Verse 
7. 

About God never changing, God is not 
making people now like he made Adam 
and Eve. God does not call upon anyone 
to offer up animal sacrifices as he once 
did. He tolerated men in time past to have 
a plurality of wives, but he does not do so 
now. He in times past required every 
male child to be circumcised, but he does 
not do so now. Gal. 5:6. Some folks think 
that Heb. 13:8 teaches that God has never 
made any changes but that is a mistake. 
He once commanded Joshua and his 
people to march around Jerico to cause 
the walls to fall down, but such would not 
happen now nor is it required. 

The Gospel of Jesus Christ is the power 
of God unto salvation has been since 
Jesus acct'nded into Heaven. When a 
person the pure Gospel of Christ is 
taught, and is believed, and the person 
repents of his sins, and coinfesses Christ 
before men, and is Baptized for the 
remissing of sins, is then a saved person. 
(Rom. 1:16,17) (Rom. 10:17) (Rom. 
6:17,18) (Acts. 17:30) (1 Cor. 1:21) 
(Luke 12:8) (Acts, 2:38) (Acts. 22:16) 
(Gal. 3:26-29) and if that person reads the 
New Testament and lives by what it 
teaches, his spirit will be a holy spirit. 

The gift of the Holy Spirit is not the 
Holy Spirit Himself, the gift is salvation 
from sin, and the promise of eternal life. 

By Lynda!! Williams 
TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 

EDrTOR'S NOTE: Clyde Hand, past 
Li Governor of Kiwanis of Arlington 
sent the following article to Joy Gerking, 
local Kiwanis Club president with this 
comment, "Bob Pipes will make a great 
contribution to your community and your 
Kiwanis Club." Vanda King 

By ROBERT CADWALLADER 
Special to Fort Worth 

Star-Telegram 

MANSFIELD — Bob Pipes was a Bell 
Helicopter inspector when he decided he 
had yet to find his life's calling. 

Taking time off to do some traveling 
ministry, teaching all over the state, 
convinced him of it. 

"Then when I came back to work at Bell 
Helicopter, I was so miserable," he said. 
"I knew I wanted to make a change." 

At 30, he went to preaching school. 
And, he says, "I never looked back." 

Now he's looking ahead to his latest 
assignment, one that will take him from 
Mansfield, which has been his home for 
the past nine years. 

He was preacher for Mansfield Church 
of Christ his first three years in town. But 
he stepped down, and has spent the past 
six years helping the church with other 
ministerial duties. He started job hunting, 
he said, when the urge to preach over-
came him. 

Last weekend, his friends hosted a 
farewell luncheon for him and his wife, 
Patsy. Soon afterward, the couple headed 
to Cross Plains near Abilene, where Pipes 
will take over the pulpit at the Church of 
Christ. 

"I did want to get back into preaching 
itself, on a regular basis," said Pipes, 54,  
an Erath County native who has been 
minister of four Churches of Christ in  

If the Holy Spirit should enter a person, 
that would be another case of incarnation. 

Paul said in Phil. 2:5 "Let this mind be 
in you which was in ChristJesus that does 
not mean that Christ's personal mind 
comes into person. It simply means that 
Christians are to think and act like Christ 
as much as humanly possible. 

Why anyone is unable to understand 
that the supernatural was not to continue 
after full revelation of the plan of salva-
tion was given is not easy to comprehend. 

The Apostle Paul makes abundantly 
clear that the supernatural gifts were to 
cease when that which is perfect is come. 
And it does not say when He who is 
perfect is come; as some teach it. The 
Greek reads, "When comes the perfect 
thing." "The in part, will be abolished." 

The out pouring of the Holy Spirit came 
upon the Apostles on the day of Pente-
cost. The Holy Spirit guided the Apostles 
unto all truth, and when John the last 
living Apostle departed this life, the 
complete Gospel truth had been given. 
And anyone who does not believe that 
was the case, does not believe the scrip-
ture. (See 2 Tim. 3:16,17) and (2 Pet. 1:3) 

If people were being Baptized by the 
Holy Spirit now as was the Apostles, they 
wouldn't need to even read the New 
Testament. They could write the com-
plete revealed will of God without look-
ing at the New Testament. And further-
more, they could raise the dead just as did 
the Apostles on various occasions. But no 
person on earth has such power now, and 
no Christian would to say there is some 
that have that power. 

A true Christian believes the Gospel of 
Christ, and 1 Cor. 1:21 says it pleases 
God by the foolishness of preaching to 
save them that believe. And when a per-
son hears and believes the Gospel of 
Christ, that person will obey it. (Heb. 5:8, 
9) and after he has obeyed the Gospel of 
Christ, he is not ashamed to wear the 
name of Christ by being called a Chris-
tian (Acts. 11:26) (1 Pet 4:16) (Col. 
3:17) Christians believe there is some-
thing in a name. (Acts. 4:12) 

Folks are saved when they hear, believe 
and obey the Gospel of Christ, (Heb. 5:8, 
9) (Rom. 6:17, 18)(2 Thess. 2:13, 14) and 
if they continue in the faith and walk by it 
(2 Cor. 5:7) and continue until death 
claims them, they will live with Jesus in 
eternity. (Rev. 2:10 and Rev. 14:13) 
Paid for by Frank Lilly, Box 858, 

Clyde, Texas 79510. 

AUSTIN - lbxas lawmakers 
passed a controversial bill limit-
ing businesses' liability for dam-
age caused by various products in-
cluding tobacco and alcohol and 
advanced another bill tightening 
paroles for convicted murderers. 

Meanwhile, Ross Perot entered 
the U.S. Senate arena by calling 
all candidates to meet with his 
citizens watchdog group, United 
We Stand America, possibly to 
endorse a candidate, but certainly 
to influence the outcome. 

Texas, Kansas, and Missouri. 
"Usually, the preaching ministry in-

volves more areas of work. It's more 
rounded, I guess. You involve yourself in 
people's lives in more levels, in different 
ways. Of course, in a larger congregation, 
it's impossible for anyone to do it all." 

That won't be a problem in Cross Plains, 
where his congregation will consist of 
125 people. Its Mansfield counterpart 
had about three times that number. 

chHurc

e will be the "only paid person" at the 

Pipes leaves behind not only a life of 
ministerial achievement in Mansfield but 
also of community involvement He has 
been a Kiwanis Club member and presi-
dent, and he'll carry tht bond with him to 
the Cross Plains Kiwanis. 

He was a charter member of the Keep 
Mansfield Beautiful Committee, and a 
former chairman of the Chamber of 
Commerce's ambassadors, who visit and 
welcome new businesses and arrange 
ribbon cutting ceremonies. 

"He went out and really made an effort 
to make you really feel welcome," said 
chamber manager Shirley Karznia. 
Pipes, a close friend of her husband, 
served as a pallbearer at his ftmeral, she 
said. 

Pipes could usually be found at the 
scene of good will, friends say. 

The monthly birthday parties at the 
Mansfield Nursing Center will never be 
the same without Pipes. 
"He's great with them," said Doris 

Hopkins, activities director for the 
nursing center. "I think he really cares 
about the elderly. They feel like he's a 
friend, someone they can talk to, relate to. 
He always calls out their birthdays and 
tells how many years young they are. 

"We're going to miss himrti lot"  

Dear Friend, 
Thank you for the three gifts my 

neighbors and I received from you 
around February 13th. The little cowdog 
pups are as cute as all the others you've 
dumped in our area over the last few 
years. It's a nice gesture for you to sneak 
out every year and leave these anony-
mous presents, but we've had all the 
"gift" we can stand. 

Also, could you stop spreading word of 
what a good dumping spot this is? Re-
cently, five large dogs were left, one of 
which just had five pups. Add that to the 
three you left and those my neighbors and 
I already own (Many thanks to you!), and 
the dogs outnumber the cottontails out 
here! 

I have three dogs and twenty cats al-
ready; recently three grown dogs were 
left here, one of which is expecting. 
That's 26 pets to feed and take care of, and 
the breeding season's just starting. 

The last think I needed was another 
"gift" from you! If you keep your female 
pet; please grow up enough to be re-
sponsible for her offspring or pay the 
price to have her spayed. We don't de-
serve your burdens, not to mention the 
fact that it is cruel to drop off pups as 
young as theses, especially in the weather 
we've had lately. 

How a man treats an animal tells you a 
lot about his character! You could have 
just as easily have driven to a shelter in a 
nearby city. They are set up to handle 
your problem better than us and wouldn't 
mind it near as much! If you can't afford 
the fee, I know of one animal shelter that 
has outside pens where you could leave 
pups after hours, no questions asked. 

If you continue to leave "gifts' in the 
Liberty Cemetery area between Pioneer 
and Sabanno, you take a great risk of 
being seen and reported to authorities. If 
you would like the address of this par-
ticular animal shelter, stop by my house 
sometime and I'll give it to you; besides 
your puppy misses you and would like to 
see you, and I would really like to meet 
you so I can "Thank" you in person. 

Thanks, but no thanks, 
Brenda Nelson 

Under the products liability bill, 
tobacco and alcohol companies 
could not be held liable for dam-
ages because consumers already 
should know their products are 
classified as unsafe. 

Consumer groups oppose the 
bill, which supporters say would 
improve Texas' business climate. 

A spokesman for Gov. Ann 
Richards, said the governor is 
planning to sign the bill. 

The House passed and sent to the 
Senate a measure that will require 
the entire 18-member state parole 
board to review the parole request 
of a prison inmate convicted of a 
capital felony. 

The bill by Rep. Allen Place, 
D-Gatesville, requires two-thirds 
of the board members to approve 
a parole of a capital felon. The 
current policy requires a simple 
majority vote. 

Perot Summons Candidates 
Perot asked all candidates in the 

May 1 Texas U.S. Senate race to 
meet at his office last week; most 
sent representatives, while former 
Attorney General Jim Mattox was 
expected to attend himself. 

Perot then started a statewide 
speaking tour to rally new mem-
bers to his organization with ap-
pearances in Austin, San Antonio 
and Houston. 

Perot is holding out the possi-
bility that the group may throw its 
weight behind an anointed candi-
date in the crowded U.S. Senate 
race. 

Some supporters hope Perot will 
decide to become a candidate him-
self; some Texans are surprised he 
isn't a candidate already, based on 
his 21 percent Texas showing in the 
presidential election and his per-
sonal wealth to finance a campaign. 

Common wisdom has it that 
Perot simply wants to shape the vic- 
tor's approach to solving crucial 
problems, but the speculation that 
a grassroots Perot draft could de-
velop at any time is too powerful to 
ignore. 

Clinton Endorses Krueger 
President Clinton, meanwhile, 

sent a letter to Texas Democratic 
Party movers and shakers endorsing 
interim Sen. Bob Krueger. 

"To demonstrate our loyalty to 
the party, we must rally around 
Bob Krueger," Clinton wrote in the 
letter being widely circulated. 

Krueger, however, failed to get  

Dear Editor, 
The Adolescent Pregnancy and Par-

enthood Advisory council (APPAC) was 
created by the Texas Legislature in 1987. 
In their 1990 report to the Legislature the 
Council recommended school based 
health clinics. When their recommenda-
tions were not mandated by the 1991 
Legislature, nine regional meetings were 
held in preparation of a State Summit, 
sponsored by Governor Richards. The 
Southern Governor's Association se-
cured 550,000 to fund the summit. The 
Texas Education Agency, the Texas 
Department of Health, and the Texas 
Department of Human Services gave 
S10,000 each for the meeting. That 
amounts to S30,000 of our tax dollars 
used to usurp parents' rights. 

Under the current Texas Law and U.S. 
Supreme Court rulings, a minor can ob-
tain birth control and abortion without 
parent consent or knowledge, but school 
based clinics will provide easy access 
and place on this the school's stamp of 
approval. These clinics would provide 
reproduction health care, sexual coun-
seling, distribution of condoms, pills, and 
"explicit" advice on abortions for teens. 
The Governor's Task Force also calls for 
these clinics. 

There would be a mandated K-12 sex 
curriculum (mandated means the schools 
must use a State Curriculum). The De-
partment of Health recommends the 
SIECUS guidelines. The T.E.A. is de-
veloping an "Education for Self Re-
sponsibility," a K-12 teen pregnancy 
prevention curriculum. Remember, the 
schools are not allowed to teach the 
morals that God established, so the void 
is filled with instructions for the "lust of 
the flesh." 

Who will profit? Sex education pub-
I ishers, contraceptive manufacturers, the 
abortion industry which reaps $600 mil-
lion annually, and pornographers, be-
cause youth will be desensitized to im-
morality. Who pays the bill? You do! The 
tax payer. 

Senate Bill 20 was already in commit-
tee on February 15 to mandate the 
APPAC recommendations. 

Please write your State Senators and 
State Representatives and the following 
APPAC members expressing opposition 
to mandated sex education and curricu-
lum, and school based health clinics. 

Also, ask State Legislature to sponsor 
legislation to abolish APPAC. 

Teachers, parents, grandparents, let 
your voice be heard. The following ad-
dresses may be used: 

Write to the Governor. Governor Ann 
Richards, P.O. Box 1248, Austin, TX 
78701. 

Your State Representative: Represen-
tative John Cook, P.O. Box 2910, Austin, 
TX 78769. 

Your State Senator: Senator Steve 
Carriker, P.O. Box 12068, Austin, TX 
78711. 

Write to these APPAC members (in 
bold) to express your opinion: 

Lionel Meno, Commissioner, Texas 
Education Agency, 1701 N. Congress 
Avenue, Austin, TX 78701. 

Texas Conference of Churches, 6633 
Highway 209 STE 200, Austin, TX 
78723-1157. 

Shirley Igo, President 
Texas Congress of Parents & Teachers 

(State PTA), 308 W. 1 1 th, Austin, TX 
78701. 

Sincerely; 
Rt. 1 Box 181 

Rising Star, TX 76471 

the endorsement of the Mexican 
American Democrats convention 
delegates last week; Dallas attorney 
Jose Angel Gutierrez won enough 
delegate votes to keep Krueger 
from the two-thirds needed to en-
dorse. 

Senate OKs Savings Bill 
The Texas Senate has approved 

$1.4 billion in savings and book-
keeping tricks recommended by 
Comptroller John Sharp as part of a 
plan to balance the state budget and 
provide the current level of services 
without raising taxes. 

Lt. Gov. Bob Bullock com-
mended Sharp "for giving us a 
blueprint for action." 

"Comptroller Sharp's recom-
mendations are a combination of 
new efficiencies for state gov-
ernment and bookkeeping actions 

which serve this state well," Bul-
lock said. 

The Senate passed nine bills to-
taling $1.4 billion in savings. An-
other 10 bills to save an additional 
$900 million are pending. 

Friends, Food, Fun 

Helicopter Inspector Land In The Pulpit 



PHILLIPS Food Plaza 
Now Featuring 

Domino's Pizza 
Call Ahead 

(817) 725-6179 
In 10 Minutes Enjoy 

Fresh Hot Domino's Pizza 

PARADE 
CRACKERS 

59' 
1 LB. BOX 

MR. PIBB 
2 LITERS 

BASIC 
CIGARETTES 

12.99 
PER CARTON 

BIRTHDAY Private Applicators 
Certification Training 
To Be Held March 8 

MARCH 7 
Mrs. D.C. Hargrove. Jr. 
Mrs. Henry Meador 
Dwight Black 
Billy Black 
Diane Bowden 
Juanita Free 
Carl Corley 
Ann Holland 
Shelly Gray 
Bill Rutledge 

MARCH 8 
Jane Rowen 
Mrs. Jack McCarty 
DeeAnn (Coppinger) Key 
Jerre! Whiteside 
Jennifer Johnston 
Betty P. Bean 
Mrs. R.W. Purvis 
Paula (Allen) Keeney 

MARCH 9 
Jack Tunnel), Jr. 

James Letney 
Chris Kitchens 
Mrs. Bill Smoot 
Debbie Hargrove 
Edgar Sessions 
Mrs. C.A. Walker 
Rene Aiken 
Mrs. David Burchfield 
Merrie Hopson 
Gerald Stephens 

MARCH 10 
Donald James Couch 
Rainey Blue Bacon 
Gloria Peninger 
Jerry Wayne Calhoun 
Carl David Scott 
Turner Simpson 
Glenda (Gould) Callaway 
Glen Shofner 
Duane Thomas 

MARCH 11 
Lucille Hester 
Darrell Smithson 
Mrs. J.T. Sheppard 
Amanda Goble 
Carl McCord 
Bob Carthen 
Jimmy Gattis 
Vickie Moon 
Amber Denee' Jennings 
Ronnie Gene Gregory 
Brenda Simpson 
Stacie Oliver 
Trudy Rae (Newman) Burks 

Project Pride will hold their regular 
monthly meeting Tuesday, March 9, at 6 

p.m. at the Howard House. 
The public is invited. 
Revival at United Methodist Church 
Rev. John Lukert of St. Barnabas 

United Methodist Church in Arlington 
will be preaching the spring revival at the 

, local United Methodist Church on Sun-
'day through Tuesday, March 7-9. -Rev. 
Lukert's message will be one of encour- 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Boatright of 
Cross Plains and Myrtle Wilson of Rising 
Star recently attended the funeral service 
of their nephew, Bill Word, at Lone 
Grove, Oklahoma. 

He is the father to the Word Gospel 
Singers who have performed locally and 
arc well known throughout the United 
States. 

Suma Dill's visitors were Minnie 
Swann, Erma Floyd, Fred Dill, Johnnie 
Bland, Mr. and Mrs. Leo Thompson, 
Carla Mustan, Joe Howser of Abilene, 
and Gaylon Duggan of Rising Star. 

' March 4, 1993 

agement and inspirauon as we are taken 
on -A Closer Walk With Jesus.- 
Services will begin at 6:30 each 

evening with special music being offered 
by Rev. Don and Betty Roath of Blanket_ 
A reception will be held in the Fellow ship 
Hall following the Sunday evening ser-
vices. 

Some may remember Rev. Luken from 
his time of service in Brown wood. Don 
and Betty Roath led the singing at the 
Fish Fry and Gospel Sing last June at the 
local church. 
All are warmly invited to attend this 

time of revival as we approach the Easter 
season. 

ASCS 
NEWS 
Scotty H. Odom, County Executive 

Director of the Callahan County 
Agricultural Stabilization and 
Conservation Service, said price 
support loans on 1992 wheat, oats, rye 
and barley will be available through 
March 31, 1993. Loans on corn, 
sorghum, cotton, and soybeans are 

HAPPY 
MARCH 5 
Mrs. Dwayne Wilson 

Dannes (Dickson) Turner 
Loy Don Black 
Benson Dale Clark 
John Prentice 
Sylvia Switzer 
Edith Pauline Hinesly 
Steve Hargrove 
Francis Staggs 
Mike Peacock 
Betty Fisher 
Gary Wayne Callaway 
Carol Rogers 
Kelly Austin 

MARCH 6 
Marie Fletcher 
Mrs. Gene Wilcoxen 
David Dallas 
John Chesshir 
Becky (Stone) Wood 
Jerry Tate 
Reuben McCowen 
Landon Pope 
Janis Dean 
Jeffery Key 
Butch Webb 
Kenneth Jordan 
Mrs. Hiram Brooks 
Ruth (Burleson) Hutchins 
Dickie Gilland 
Vicki Johnston 

available through May 31. 
"Many farmers use our price support 

loans program to obtain interim 
operating capital or hold their grain for 
future delivery," Odom said. The loans 
have a nine-month maturity date with 
variable monthly interest rates. 
"Maturing 1993-crop wheat is not 
eligible for the farmer-owned reserve," 
he said. 

To be eligible for price support loans 
and other farm program benefits, 
producers must participate in the 
acreage reduction programs. The 1993 
programs open March 1. 
Producer who are interested in 

obtaining a price support loan should do 
so before March 31, for small grains, 
and before May 31 for corn, sorghum, 
cotton and soybeans. 

Eligibility for participation in all 
programs administered by ASCS is 
established by law without regard to 
race, color, religion, six, age, national 
origin, marital status, physical or mental 
handicap, political affiliation, or 
sponsorship club. 

A private applicators certification 
training will be held on Monday. March 
8. in Taylor County-  beginning at 8:30 
a.m. in the Old Courthouse. Extension 
Meeting Room on the 3rd floor. This 
training is for agriculture producers who 
wish to obtain a private applicators  

license. This training is not for CEU. For 
more information contact the Tayior 
County Extension Office at 674-1321 or 
the Callahan County Extension Office 
at 854-1518. 

Greg Gangross 
County Extension Agent 

8 — Cross Plains Review 

Project Pride Meets 
Tuesday, March 9 

ANNOUNCING 
CROSS PL.-1,ENS 

PEANUT & FARM EQUIPMENT 

CONSIGNMENT SALE 

SATURDAY, APRIL 17 
TO CONSIGN CONTACT: 

JOE IIANKE JR. (night) 8177725-6562 
(day. ) 8177725-6116 

JAMES LAWRENCE (day) 817/725-7216 
HENRY EDDINGTON (night) 8177725-6227 

Sponsored by Kiwanis of Cross Plains 

KEVIN HUTSON 
	

11 

auctioneers 
Licans• Nymblw TXS-019-0011726 

	c  ,err. 
1111:110 

AUCTIONEERS - REALTORS APPRAJSERS 
1006 EAST BROADWAY - SWEETWATER. TEXAS 71664 

91S/23S-9631 

FISH 
Now Is the time for Pond an d Lake Stocking Hybrid Bluegill, Boas, Channel 

Catfish, Fathead Minnows, Triplold Grass Carp, and Black Crappie. 
The Hybrid Bluegill will REACH the weight of 2 1/2 to 3 lbs. 
We furnish your Hauling Containers. We guarantee live delivery. 
Supplies - Fish Feeders, Turtle Traps, Liquid Fertiliser, and Commerleal 

Fish Cages. 
Delivery will be WEDNESDAY, MARCH 10, at the times listed for the 

following towns and locations. 
RANGER - H & R FEED, 547-5311, 8:00-9:00 A.M. 
CISCO - FARM & RANCH SUPPLY, 442-2535, 10:00-11:00 A.M. 
RISING STAR - COOPERS TEXACO, 543.1505, 12:00-1:00 P.M. 
CROSS PLAINS - CROSS PLAINS GRAIN & PEANUT CO., 725-7345, 2:00- 

3:00 P.M. 
SANTA ANNA - SIMMONS FEED & SUPPLY, 345.3158, 4:00-5:00 P.M. 

Call you local Feed Store to place your order 
or call: 405-777-2202 -- FAX 405-777-289! 

Toll Free: 1-800.4334950 
Fishery consultant available. Special Deliveries on large ponds and lake orders. 

DUNN'S FISH FARM 
P.O. Box 85 

FITTWTOWN, OK 74842  

USED PICKUPS 
MON. THRU SAT. 
6 A.M. — 10 P.M. 
SUNDAY 
I A.M. -- 8 P.M. 
OPEN 7 DAYS-A-WEEK 
WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS 

Lakeway Grocery 
(817) 725-7174 

CROSS PLAINS. TX 
SUBJECT TO 

STOCK ON HAND 

LITTLE STORE -- LITTLE PRICES 

MARCH 4TH THRU MARCH 10TH 
1991 Ford Explorer, 2WD, loaded only 45,000 miles 
1992 Ford Aerostar van, air, automatic, 48,000 miles 
1987 GMC 1/2 TON, LWB, auto, V8, 52,000 miles, nice 
1991 Chev. 3/4 ton, X-cab, 4x4, 56,000 miles 
1988 Chev. 1 ton, cab & chassis, automatic, 60,000 miles 
1990 Chev. 1/2 ton, V8, automatic, 23,000 miles 
1988 Chev. 3/4 ton Suburban, 49,000 miles, a RV Special 
1990 Chev. Conversion Suburban, loaded, 49,000 miles 
1992 Dodge Dakota Club Cab 4x4 V6, 17,000 miles 
1990 Chev. Crew Cab Silverado, flatbed, loaded, 39,000 miles 
1991 Chev. S10 LT Blazer, 4 dr., fully loaded, 22,000 miles 
1990 Ford 1/2 ton 6 cyl. SWB, 56,000 miles 
1987 Nissan Pathfinder XE V6, very clean 
1991 Chev. S10, 4 cyl. 5-speed, 48,000 miles 
1989 AmeriCoach Motor Home, 22,000 miles, very clean 
1991 Chev. S10 Blazer, 2 dr., fully loaded, 28,000 miles 
1991 Jeep Cherokee 4 dr., 4 Wheel drive, 12,000 miles 
1991 Chev. S10, V6 Auto trans., 18,000 actual miles 
1991 Chev. 1/2 ton EXT Cab Silverado, loaded, 16,000 miles 
1990 Chevrolet S10 Blazer, 4x4, 33,000 miles 
1987 Chev. El Camino, fully loaded 
1989 Mazda SR5 Pup, 32,000 miles 
1987 Chev. S10 Ext. Cab, auto, air cond., good work truck 
1989 Chev. 1/2 ton ext. cab Silverado, conversion, 30,000 miles 
1992 Chev. 1/2 ton ext. cab Silverado, loaded, 19,000 miles 
1990 Chev. Astro Van, fully loaded, 40,000 miles 
1989 Chev. Suburban, fully loaded, 49,000 miles 
1988 Chev. 1/2 ton 350-V8 auto air power, 58,000 miles 
1989 Chev. Astro Van, fully loaded, 42,000 miles 
1986 Ford Ranger, economical work truck 
1988 GMC Suburban, 58,000 miles 
1887 Ford 3/4 ton, 4-wheel drive, XL 
1987 Ford Bronco II, fully loaded 
1986 lsuzu Trooper II, diesel, 4x4 
1989 Ford 1/2 ton Super Cab 4x4, loaded, 52,000 miles 
1988 GMC Suburban, fully loaded, 71,000 miles 
1977 Ford 1 ton flatbed, good work truck 
1991 Chev. Astro Van, fully loaded, 18,000 miles 

BAYER MOTOR 
COMPANY, INC. 

218 E. Grand, Comanche 	 (915) 356-2541 
1 800 843-5230 

MIN 	=11 	IIM ME IMLMEJNE MIRAMII 

PARADE 
TISSUE 

4 ROLL PKG. 

69' 
CHECK OUR INSTORE SPECIALS 
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