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BRONCS TO ENGAGE CYCLONES 
ON LOCAL FIELD FRIDAY NIGHT 
IN TRADITIONAL GAME

The Clarendon Bronchos will
meet the Memphis Cyclones on ! REGULAR SERVICES AT
Broncho Field here Friday night 
in the traditional game of the 
season. This is always an unpre*- 
dictable gfm e as either team is 
expected to perform the unex­
pected and the underdog, if there 
is such, always has an equal 
chance to win.

The Cyclones have had a hard 
season so far and lost all their 
games but they have been en­
countering some stiff competi­
tion. Last week they showed 
themselves well by holding 
Shamrock to only 7 points.

Coach Tom Harrell reports the 
Broncs in pretty fair condition 
for the game although one or 
more regulars may be out of the 
line-up due to lime burns receiv­
ed in the game last Friday night. 
The entire squad will be in there 
doing their very best to win if at 
all possible, for it is always heart­
breaking to lose to the Cyclones. 
There’s one thing that might les­
sen the importance of the game 
and that is the fact that it w ill 
be non-conference this year. This 
is the first time to our knowledge 
that the two teams have not been 
in the same conference.

It has been announced that a 
fu ll scale pep rally w ill be held 
tonight at 7 o’clock in front of the 
Rexall. Everyone is urged to 
come out and help build the 
spirit needed to beat the Mem­
phis bays.

The Band Parents organization 
w ill have their stand open as 
usual with plenty of eats, hot 
coffee and cold drinks. Keep this 
in mind while you are out Friday 
night backing the Broncs all the 
way.

LOCAL METHODIST 
CHURCH SUNDAY

Rev. John English, pastor of 
the local Methodist Church, will 
return home Saturday from 
Hondo, Texas where he has been 
assisting in an evangelistic cam­
paign there the past week. Sun­
day services'will be held as usual 
at the local church. Rev. C. A. 
Green wait, pastor of the Fred­
ericksburg Methodist Church will 
come here Oct. 28 for a week un­
der the exchange program which 
is being carried out all over the 
state. .

Highway Lighting 
Now Completed

Construction crews of the West 
Texas Utilities Company have 
completed work on the lighting 
facilities along the highway, both 
east and west of the main street. 
Actual operation cannot com­
mence till a special transformer 
is received. The order for this 
transformer was placed several 
months ago but material short­
ages have caused delay. The 
erection of these additional light­
ing facilities was a project of the 
Chamber of Commerce Civic Im­
provement Committee of which 
Bob Moss and Alvin Landers are 
co-chairmen.

New Laundry To 
Hold Opening 
Monday, Oct. 15

The Nu-Deal Laundry is mak­
ing announcement in this issue of 
the Leader of its official opening 
Monday, October 15. The new 
business will be operated by the 
owner, Roy Crutchfield, long 
time resident of Clarendon.

The Nu-Deal Laundry is locat­
ed six blocks east of the stop­
light in the building formerly 
occupied by Nichols & Baxter 
Monument Works. Mr. Crutch­
field stated that his helpy-selfy 
type laundry would be modem 
and convenient in every respect 
with 12 machines available for 
use. Read the Nu-Deal’s adver­
tisement in this issue of the Lad- 
er for full particulars.

REBEKAH LODGE TO 
HAVE MEXICAN SUPPER

The Clarendon Rebekah Lodge 
149 Wifi hbki iheii*annual J^ext- 
can supper Saturday night, Nov. 
3rd, from 6 to 8:30 in the dining 
room of the Clarendon Hotel.

Tickets will go on sale Wednes­
day, Oct. 17, at $1 a plate. Euy 
your tickets now from the 
Rebekahs.

Mrs. Billy Salmon 
Rites Held Saturday

Funeral services for Mrs. B illy 
Salmon, 39, who died late Thurs­
day, Oct. 4, in her home, were 
conducted at 2:30 p. m. Saturday 
from the Brice Baptist church in 
Brice, with Rev. Milton Evans,, 
pastor, officiating, assisted by 
Rev. Wayne Naylor and Rev. Roy 
Shahan.

Burial was in the Citizens’ 
Cemetery in Clarendon under 
direction of Murphy-Spicer Fun­
eral Home.

Mrs. Salmon’s death was ruled 
a suicide Thursday night after an 
inquest held by Coroner J. S. 
Grimes of Memphis. Officers said 
death was caused by a single 
bullet in the head from a .22 
caliber pistoL

The husband and son were at 
work and a daughter-in-law, Mrs. 
B illy Morgan Salmon, was in the 
farm-yard, when the shot was 
fired, officers said.

Relatives said Mrs. Salmon had 
besn in ill health for some time.

Survivors include the husband 
and son, Billy Morgan Salmon, 
both of the Brice community; the 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. S. 
Smith of Memphis; three sisters, 
Mrs. B. O. Jones, Memphis, Mrs. 
Ruby Hancock of Lakeview, and 
Mn. Mattie Eastland of Waco; 
and a brother, Bailey Smith of 
Borger.

H. W. LOVELL HAS LATEST 
PEACH CROP ON RECORD

H. W. Lovell, prominent resi­
dent of the Ashtola community, 
has approximately 35 Indian 
Peach trees with an above-the- 
average crop. The thing that has 
puzzled Mr. Lovell is the lateness 
of the peaches. This is the first' 
year, according to his records, 
that the peaches have ripened in 
October. One of the peaches 
brought to the Leader office 
measured 10V4t inches in circum­
ference. The Indian peach is a 
very good variety and there is 
quite a demand for the crop Mr. 
Lovell is now gathering. •

Qnoen Candidates 
Chv ose Escorts For 
Halloween Carnival

A  complete list of queen can­
didates and their escorts was 
made available this week with 
the High School and College 
holding elections this week. 
Candidates and their escorts are 
First Grade— Patti Lane, Charlie 
Slavin; Second grade— Judy Ben­
son; Larry Stewart; Third grade 
—Martha Jo Risley, Raymond 
Neal Carter; Fourth grade— 
Glenell Hoggatt, Jerry Hicks; 
Fifth grade—Betty Brown, Jim­
my Bain; Sixth grade— Frances 
Wright, Richard Vallance! Sev­
enth grade— Glenda Borden, Leo 
Luttrell; Eighth grade— Wanda 
Lewis, Tommy Lane; Ninth grade 
—Doris Swinney, Jesse Scott; 
Tenth grade — Shirley Martin, 
Tommy Hodnett; Eleventh grade 
—Jo Anne Montgomery, Don 
Thornberry; Twelfth grade — 
Noma Lee Lewis, Frank Jones. 
Ida Mae Brown will represent the 
Clarendon Junior College and 
Ralph Ayers will be her escort.

You may cast your vote for 
your favorite candidate wherever 
boxes may be over town. Votes 
will be 1 cent each. At press time 
no official count had been made 
as to tfcu number of votes cast 
this week. Information pertain­
ing to this phase of the Carnival 
may be turned in to Mrs. Homer 
Estlack, Chairman of the Queen 
Contest.

To Speak Tonight

LET S RIDE THE 
MERRY-GO-ROUND

First grade students and their 
teachers, Mrs. Brown and Mrs. 
Ballew, are sponsoring the oper­
ation of a Merry-Go-Round on 
the comer next to Piggly-W iggly 
Grocery on Mein Street. Rides 
are 10 cents with proceeds going 
to room activities. You may ride 
Saturday afternoons or Monday 
and Wednesday afternoons from 
3 o’clock to 4 o’clock.

Hershel Heath has loaned the 
equipment and Piggly-W iggly is 
donating the electricity to oper­
ate.

EXTENSION COURSE 
OFFERED

An extension course, Educa­
tion 491, for which college credit 
w ill be given, was begun Wed­
nesday night of this week at the 
Clarendon High School. Dr. J. B. 
Roberts, head of the Education 
department at West Texas State 
College, Canyon, is teaching the 
course with lessons being held 
every Wednesday night through­
out the first semester of school.

The course is on "Evaluation” 
and will take up a study of the 
Clarendon School System, its 
pupils, the community, its 
church os, and parents within the 
community. A  number of teach­
ers in Donley County are enrolled 
for the course.

Donley County Game 
Association Formed 
And Officers Elected

At a meeting held last Monday 
night in the Lelia Lake Auditor­
ium, the Donley County Game 
Association was formed and of­
ficers elected for the ensuing 
year. Lee Shaller was named 
president of the group, with Will 
Chamberlain and Sid Pointer as 
vice president and secretary, re­
spectively. In addition to these 
officers a board of directors was 
elected to handle the detail work 
of the organization, including the 
formulation of a set of By-laws

More than twenty members 
were signed up at Monday nights 
meeting, bringing several thous­
and acres of land under jurisdic­
tion of the Association. Many 
others have voiced an interest in 
the organization and a large 
number of additional members 
are expected as soon as land 
owners can be contacted. A  mem­
bership fee of $5.00 will be charg­
ed which goes into a fund to de­
fray the expenses of the associ­
ation.

H. ty. Breedlove was named to 
head a committee appointed to 
handle the procurement and erec­
tion of signs. Large signs w ill be 
erected at points where main 
highways enter the county and 
other signs will be placed on 
property of members of the as­
sociation.

Hunters wishing to hunt on 
land in the association may do so 
only after securing a permit from 
the secretary and paying the re­
quired fee of $4.00 per day. The 
hunter will then b* directed to a 
specific place to hunt where the 
land owner w ill sign his permit. 
I f  he so desires, a land owner 
may refuse to allow any hunting 
at all on his property, or if hunt­
ing is allowed, he may specify the 
number of hunters per day and 
their bag limit. The bag limit, 
however, must not exceed that 
set by state law.

Any hunter found taking birds 
without a permit on land in the 
association w ill be in violation of 
the state game laws and w ill be 
subject to prosecution.

It is hoped that a majority of 
the land owners in -the county, 
w ill see fit to take part in this 
move to control bird hunting. It 
is a step toward the prevention 
of wholesale slaughter of birds, 
both in and out of season. It also 
guarantees the hunter a place to 
hunt without being molested, as 
long as he abides by the rules of 
the association and the game 
laws of the state of Texas,

E. R. EUDALY

E. R. Eudaly, noted livestock 
specialist of Ft. Worth, w ill speak 
here tonight at the College audi­
torium at 7:30 p. m. Mr. Eudaly 
is one of the most widely recog­
nized authorities on livestock 
nutrition, feeding and manage­
ment and has spoken here on a 
previous occasion. Before becom­
ing connected with Universal 
Mills, he was head of both the 
swine and dairy divisions of 
Texas A&M College Extension 
Service. Theories mean nothing 
to Mr. Eudaly unless they can be 
put into actual practice and made 
to pay dividends.

A ll livestock raisers in this 
area and others interested are in­
vited to hear Mr. Eudaly speak.

Rain And Hail 
Damages Crops 
Over County

A  severe rain and hail storm 
which moved in last Friday af­
ternoon left several strips of 
devastation across parts of Don­
ley County. The storm was quite 
freakish in its movements, jump­
ing and skipping along cleaning 
out some crops completely and 
doing partial damage to others. 
One strip was reported south of 
town with the movement east­
ward across Windy Valley and 
on into Hall County. Another 
area hit was a strip beginning in 
the Goldston community, con­
tinuing on eastward down Red 
River along the Midway and 
Naylor communities. Some hail 
was reported in general over 
most of the county with rainfall 
being measured up to three 
inches. The measurement here in 
town varied from 1.20 inches up 
to 1.60 inches. The recording at 
Lelia Lake was 1.50 inches. Loss­
es were estimated from a slight 
damage to 100 percent by various 
farmers in the hail area.

Contract Let For 
Mulberry Bridge
BAPTIST PASTORS
CONFERENCE
FORMED

The Baptist pastors of the Pan­
handle Association met Monday 
morning in an organizational 
meeting, for the purpose of form­
ing the Baptist Pastor’s Confer­
ence. The meeting was held in 
the First Baptist Church of Mem­
phis. Those present were L. A. 
Sartain, Clarendon; Ernest Phil­
lips, Martin; R. L. Self, Estelline; 
F. N. Allen, Lakeview; Roy Sha­
han, Memphis; O. L. Jones, Hed- 
ley, and Bee Nichols, Memphis. 
Nichols was elected secretary of 
the organization, and O. L. Jones, 
chairman. The time of meeting is 
Monday after first Sunday in 
each month, at First Baptist 
Church, Memphis.

The next meeting will be on 
November 5, at 10:00 A. M.

Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Lewis 
went to Wichita Falls Sunday.

Bronchos Lose To  
Panhandle 15-0

The Bronchos received tjjeir 
first fet barik of - the season last 
Friday night when the Panthers 
from Panhandle slipped on their 
mud chains and toppled the 
Broncs 15-0. Local fans think the 
score might have been different 
if they had been playing on a dry 
field. The Panthers took ad­
vantage of all breaks in the game 
and the follow up accounted for 
part of their scoring. The game 
was played in a puddle of water 
with a steady downpour of rain 
throughout most of the entire 
playing time.

Panhandle started their scor­
ing in the first quarter when 
I<ewellen plunged over from the 
1 yard line and Mitchell added 
the extra. A few minutes later 
Duane Hearn was tackled behind 
the Bronc goal line for an extra. 
The final Panther touchdown 
came when they punted out on 
the Clarendon 1 yard stripe and 
then took over when the Broncs 
fumbled on the first play. Dale 
Roselius plowed through center 
for the score.

Phelan To Head 
Church Campaign

Frank Phelan, Jr. has been 
named General Chairman of the 
Stewardship Campaign of the 
First Methodist Church of Clar­
endon. The purpose of this cam­
paign is to reach every family in 
interest of securing their pledge 
to the church budget for the 
year 1951-1952.

Working with Mr. Phelan as 
associate chairmen are: H. M 
Breedlove, Solicitation, Lynn 
Payne, Mechanics; Pheobe Ann 
Buntin and Mjfc. Fred Buntin 
Education, and Mrs. C. W. Ben 
nett. Women. Assisting these 
chairmen are fifty-six other 
workers serving on sixteen com­
mittees. Forty-four of these 
workers were present for a gen­
eral meeting of instruction at the 
church Tuesday evening, Oct. 9.

Services Held Tues. 
For Leonard L. Gay

Funeral services for Leonard 
Louis Gay, 17-year-old son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawrence Gay, were 
held Tuesday afternoop at the 
First Baptist Church with Rev. 
L. A. Sartain officiating.

The youth, a high school stu­
dent, died Sunday of a shotgun 
wound in his chest. A  verdict of 
“ accidental death by gunshot” 
was returned by Justice of the 
Peace G. A. Anderson. The boy’s 
father works for the Penrod 
Drilling Company. The family 
has lived here since July.

Survivors include the parents, 
and four sisters, Mrs. Lois Love- 
ladv of Lufkin, Lindie Ann,

The bridge on Highway 70, 
across Prairie Dog Town Fork o f 
Red River should be completed 
within about six months. The 
contract for the construction o f 
this bridge has been awarded to 
the J. B. Clardy Construction 
Company of Fort Worth. Its cost 
is $183,012.00. It is expected that 
the bridge construction workers 
will headquarter in Clarendon; 
however, materials w ill be ship­
ped to Memphis because of it be­
ing a rail point closer to the site 
of the construction.

Materials are arriving at the 
site for work on the six and one 
tenth miles of road construction 
which was recently awarded to 
a Valley Mills firm.

When the construction present­
ly contracted is completed only a 
sixteen mile gap, from Turkey 
north, w ill remain to be complet­
ed to make Highway 70. an all 
paved road from Pampa to San 
Angelo and on south. Gray Coun­
ty and the city of Pampa recent­
ly announced that they were re­
newing them efforts concerning 
further construction contracts to 
the north on Highway 70.

The construction of Highway 
70 has been a program of the 
Chamber of Commerce during 
the past several years. Recent 
contracts are the fruits of many 
years work by a lot of individ­
uals.

Two 4-H Club Steers 
Entered In State Fair

County Agent H. M. Breedlove 
stated this morning that Donley
County would have two 4-H Club 
steers entered in the State Fair o f 
Texas. The two steers will be

Claudette Mae and Georgia Nell, shown by Wayne Brown and

NEW C-C MEMBERS
Frank Phelan, Jr., President of 

the Clarendon Chamber of Com­
merce, extended the congratula­
tions of the Chamber to the fol­
lowing firms and individuals who 
have become C of C members in 
the past month: Seeds Buick Co., 
Carpenters Garage, Cudd Bros. 
Trucking Co., Whitlock and Hart 
Barber Shop, Guy Wright, J. 
Alfred McMurtry, Glenn’s Jewel­
ry, Earl Hodnett 66 Service Sta­
tion, B. N. Head, ?nd Ernest Kent 
Texas Company.

AMATEUR SHOW HAS 
BEEN CANCELLED

Tlie Senior Class sponsored 
Amateur Show which had been 
scheduled for tonight at the Col­
lege Auditorium has been cancel­
led for an indefinite time due to 
circumstances that have arisen at 
this time.

BAKE SALE
The Fifth grade w ill hold a 

bake sale Saturday, Oct. 13, in 
front of the West Texas Utilities 
from 8:30 to 11:30. They are rais­
ing money for their socials 
throughout the year. Mrs. Todd 
and Mrs. Longan are teachers of 
these grades. You are invited to 
shop for your bakery needs at 
this time.

Mr. and Mn. Herahel Heath 
and Mr. and Mn. Clyde Martin 
were Amarillo visitors Sunday.

GOODNIGHT HOME MAKERS 
CLUB TO SPONSOR 
42 PA R TY  AND BAZAAR

Everyone is cordially invited to 
come to the Community Hall. 
Friday night, Oct. 12th for games 
of 42 and a Bazaar.

There will be pie and coffee for 
every one.

FOURTH GRADES FEATURE 
PUPPET SHOW OCT. 24

The fourth grades under the 
direction of Miss Mongole and 
Mrs. Headrick will sponsor a 
Puppet Show to be held Oct. 24, 
at 1 o’clock in the High School 
Gymnasium.

A  complete program is not 
available at this time so watch 
the paper next week for further 
details.

BAND AND ORCHESTRA 
PARENTS TO MEET

Band and Orchestra parents 
will hold their regular meeting 
Monday night at 7:30 in the Bandf

all residing with the parents; a 
brother, Jerry; and the grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Louis 
Moore of Haskell.

Burial was in Willow Ceme­
tery, Haskell, Texas with the 
Murphy-Spicer Funeral Home in 
charge of funeral arrangements.

PANHANDLE KITTENS 
CLIP COLTS 20 7

The scrapping Junior High 
Colts put up a valiant fight 
against a heavier Panhandle Jr. 
High team here last Thursday 
night but the weight was too 
much. The score was 20 to 7 in 
favor of the visitors. The colts 
held their own pretty well 
through the first three quarters 
but the larger boys from Pan­
handle wore them down in the 
fourth. Chester Mann took a pass 
late in the game to go across 
the goal stripe for the Colts only 
score.

The Colts journey to Skelly- 
town this afternoon for their next 
game on their schedule.

Hall. A ll parents having children 
in the band or orchestra are 
members of the organization and 
are urged to be present for this 
important meeting.

RUTH-RICHERSON TO 
INSPECT NEW BOOKS

Ruth Richerson, County School 
Superintendent, reported this 
week that two more publishing 
houses will present books to her 
for inspection before hearings of 
the State Text Book Committee 
for the adoption of next texts are 
begun October 22. The committee 
is made up of 15 members, one of 
which is Miss Richerson.

SECOND GRADE FEATURING 
FOOD MARKET OCT. 20th

Mrs. Lloyd Johnson’s second 
grade w ill feature a Food Market 
at the West Texas Utilities office 
from 9 a. m. til 12 o’clock on the 
morning of Saturday, Oct. 20th. 
Among the items that will be for 
sale w ill be dressed hens, fryers, 
eggs, home made bread, cakes, 
pies, canned goods, etc.

Mrs. A. J. Hicks and Pamela 
and Mrs. J. I. Spurgeon visited in 
Memphis Tuesday afternoon.

P.T.A. TO HAVE 
NIGHT MEETING

The Sims P.T.A. w ill meet 
Thursday night, Oct. 18, at 8 
o’clock in the Junior High School 
Auditoriiftn. This gives fathers 
as well as mothers an opportun­
ity to take part in the organiza­
tion. A ll parents of students at­
tending Elizabeth Stevens and 
Junior High School ate urged to 
be prssent.

Following the business session, 
Mrs. Pat Powell of Childress will 
be presented as guest speaker for 
the evening.

HALLOWEEN MASQUERADE 
BALL OCTOBER 31

Bobby Burns and his Orchestra 
will furnish the music for the 
Halloween Masquerade Ball be­
ing sponsored by the Forty et 
Eight in the new American Leg­
ion Hall the night of October 31. 
An advance ticket sale is being 
conducted by all 40 St 8 'era and 
tickets are also on sale at Thorn- 
berry Drug, Bob Moss Pharmacy, 
Skelton Dry Goods Co. and Lane 
and McCully Insurance Agency.

Chauncey Homing. The steer 
shown by Wayne was bred by 
C. T. McMurtry and weighs 1250 
pounds; the steer shown by 
Chauncey was bred by Frank 
Hommel and weighs 1150 pounds. 
Both steers are Herefords and 
should give plenty of competition 
at the State Fair in the livestock 
department.

Breedlove and the two Club 
boys w ill leave for Dallas this 
Sunday afternoon as the steers 
have to be on the fair grounds on 
Monday morning. The group will 
be in Dallas until Saturday of 
next week. The sale will be held 
at 9:30 on that morning in the 
livestock arena. The judging of 
the Club steers w ill be on Wed­
nesday the seventeenth at nine 
o'clock in the livestock arena. 
Everyone who should happen to 
be in Dallas at the state fa ir at 
that time is invited to come by 
and see the steers.

Pooler (tout* Losdor. |U« a Twr.

REV. JAMES COMISKEY 
ASSIGNED TO ST. MARY'S 
CATHOLIC CHURCH HERE

Reverend James Comiskey re­
cently assigned to Saint Mary’s 
Catholic Church here offered his 
first Mass Sunday. Reverend 
Richard Vaughan, former pastor, 
who assisted at the altar read the 
Gospel and spoke a fond farewell 
to parishoners with whom he had 
worked for the past two years.

Appointment o f  Reverend 
Comiskey to the Clarendon post 
was made last week by the Most 
Reverend * Laurence FitzSimon, 
Bishop of Amarillo. Reverend 
Comiskey was formerly at 
Rowena where some 300 Catholic 
families comprised the parish. He 
w ill reside at Groom where he 
w ill teach in the school and also 
serve as assistant Priest there.

As a result of the new assign­
ment Mats w ill be offered here 
every Sunday. Resumption o f 
regularly scheduled Masses marks 
a new epoch in the history o f j 
60-year old church.

AMERICAN LEGION 
AUXILIARY NOTICE 

Members of the Legion Auxil­
iary are reminded of their regu­
lar meeting Tuesday night, Oct. 
16, beginning at 8 o’clock in the 
Legion Hall
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MEMBERS Oi?

Texas & Panhandle Press Associations

UIG JUMP—Hundreds of parachutes suspending men of the 82nd 
Airborne Division float to earth in the joint Army-Air Force maneuvers 
n ear Fort Bragg. N. C. Scenes such as this were frequent in the 
defense of the North Carolina area against a mythical "aggressor” 
force approaching from the seamnst.

H U D G I N S
Mrs Carl Barker

♦

*

Mr. and Mrs. Dan Tims of 
Levelland spent the week end 
with homefolks here.

Mr. and Mrs. Price Webb and 
family visited Sunday afternoon 
with Mr. and Mrs. R. O. Reynolds

Mr. Martha Ethridge and Mr. 
and Mrs. Ulmer of Stamford and 
Mr. and Mrs. F. E. Perdue, Mrs. 
Oma Pierce, Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Pierce, Mr. ant} Mrs. Harben 
Perdue of Amarillo visited Mr. 
and Mrs. John Perdue Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. I. J. Self and Mr. 
Blevins visited relatives at W ell­
ington Sunday.

Mrs. Pat Myers, L. L. Foster, 
Wilma and Othel Dean Elliott of 
Martin spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. W. D. Elliott.

Nellie Jon Heathington spent 
Sunday with Joyce Hall of Hed- 
ley.

Mr. and Mrs. D. R. Koontz 
spent Sunday with Mrs. U. G. 
Koontz and Doyle of Midway.

Mr. and Mrs. B. E. Walls and 
Mr. and Mrs. John Heathington 
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Walls of Lakeview.

Davis Williams made a busi­
ness trip to Amarillo Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Owen Hott visit­
ed Mr. and Mrs. I. J. Self Satur­
day night.

Mr. and Mrs. John Perdue and 
Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Perdue, Mr. 
and Mrs. Farris Keller visited 
Earl Stout Sunday at Pampa 
Hospital. Earl was operated on 
for appdendicitis Saturday morn­
ing.

Mary Lou Barker spent Satur 
day night and Sunday with Ra 
Nell Nichols.

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to take this 

means of thanking everyone for 
being so kind and thoughtful 
during the illness of F. L. Beh­
rens. We especially thank those 
making visits, and sending flow­
ers and cards. Your kindness was 
deeply appreciated.

The Behrens Family

of Martin.
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Williams 

and J. L. of Amarillo spent the 
week end with Mr. and Mrs. J. C 
Williams.

Mr. and Mrs. John Perdue and 
Mr. and Mrs. Alton and Price 
Webb made a business trip to 
Amarillo Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Goble Barker and 
Evelyn, L illie visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Barker Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Bingham 
left for Greenville Wednesday 
where they visited in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. W. W. Rudd. Friday 
they were called to Mineral Wells 
by the death of a brother-in-law. 
J. E. Oxford. Mr. Oxford died of 
a heart attack. Funeral services 
were held in Mineral Wells Sun­
day afternoon. Mr. and Mrs. 
Bingham returned to Clarendon 
Monday night.

Mrs. Ermine Blair and Biffie 
visited in Shamrock Sunday.

Announcing
THE OPENING of the

N U -D E A L
L A U N D R Y

Monday, October 15th
Located 6 Blocks East of Stop Light.

C L IP  TH IS  A D V E R T IS E M E N T  —  IT IS  W O R T H

25c on Your First Wash
During W eek of October 15th through October 20th.

t

12 M A Y T A G  W A S H E R S  FOR  H E L P Y -S E L F Y  USE. 

P L E N T Y  O F S T E A M  A N D  HOT W A T E R  

W E  D O  W E T  W A S H  A  F L U F F -D R Y  F A M IL Y  B U N D LE S . 

P IC K  U P  ft D E L IV E R Y  SER VICE  —  P H O N E  75

W e  Invite Everyone to visit and inspect our New . Roomy Laundry and get 

acquainted with the feature# w e have to offer • * • that w ill make your 

wash days much easier.

NU- DEAL LAUNDRY
C L A R E N D O N 'S  ID E A L  H E L P Y -S E L F Y  L A U N D R Y  

Roy Crutchfield, owner and operator.
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Mrs. O. T. Hill honored hus­
band with a birthday dinner Sun­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Price Webb and 
family of Hudgins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie Reynolds of Sunnyview 
visited Sunday afternoon in the 
R. O. Reynolds home.

Mary Mann of Chamberlain 
spent Saturday night with Fran­
ces Helton.

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Reynolds 
and baby ate Sunday dinner in 
the Clarence Reynolds home.

Mr. and Mrs. Seth Edens moved 
to Clarendon Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. F. C. Crofford re 
turned last Friday from a two 
weeks vacation trip up through 
Utah, Idaho, Oregon and Wash­
ington. They report a wonderful 
time.

Mrs. A. J. Sibley spent the 
week end with Mrs. Leona Jones 
in Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Oren Lee Hill and 
family, Mr. and M’.s. Nolen D. 
Hill and family spent Sunday in 
the O. T. Hill home.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Lysle of 
Clarendon spent Sunday in the 
C. C. Hearn home.

Mr. and Mrs. F. C. Crofford. 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy M. Phillips, j 
Mr. and Mrs. F. G. Crofford visit- j 
ed over the week end in Colo.

Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Helton ate 
Sunday dinner in the W. L. Jor­
dan home.

Boneta Gale Martin of Dalhart 
is visiting her grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. L. O. Christie this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Christie and 
children of Samnorwood spent
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the weekend in the L. C. Chris­
tie home with Nelson while Mr. 
and Mrs. Christie went to Las 
Cruces, N. Mex. to visit Drew. He 
is attending college there.

Mr. and Mrs.' H. E. Sibley and 
family visited Mr. and Mrs. Guy 
Sibley Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. B ill Marshall of 
Ashtola spent Sunday in the R. B 
Marshall home.

THE FIRST EXPOSURE

Range Improvement 
Field Day Oct. 13 
At Woodward

Fred R. Merrifield, General 
Agent of the Farm Credit Ad 
ministration of Wichita, Kan., 
will be principal speaker at the 
Fifteenth Annual Range Im­
provement Field Day of the 
USDA Southern Great Plains 
Field Station at Woodward and 
Fort Supply, Okla., on Saturday, 
October 13. He w ill discuss “F i­
nancial Problems of the Cattle 
Industry” following the noon- 
hour barbecue phase of the pro­
gram.

Most of the day will be de­
voted to inspection tours and 
discussi ms of ten years of graz­
ing resuits with beef cattle on 
native range and reseeded pas­
tures. The many management 
practices under investigation will 
be evaluated in terms of net 
profits obtained during the de­
cade of study. These economic 
appraisals have been made thru 
the cooperation of specialists in 
the Oklahoma A&M College’s 
Department of Agricultural Eco­
nomics and the USDA Bureau o f 
Agricultural Economics.

The economic theme of the 
meeting will be emphasized in 
the principal address by Merri-

•ny.i,;i»fj

* . W  V *  -*• • >

, __ JR:

field. As leader o f many financial 
agencies, his address will be of 
special interest. He is a graduate 
of Oklahoma A&M College and 
a veteran of World War I. A fter»
serving as a ranch manager in 
Texas he * worked as County 
Agent in Woodward County, 
Okla., for three years and was 
District Agent in Northwestern 
Oklahoma for ten years. This in­
cluded a Marge pari of the area 
served by the Southern Great 
Plains Field Station. He was rais­
ed on a stock farm near Enid.

j Okla., and still owns and operates 
the farm there.

The general public is invited to
attend this educational meeting 
by D. A. Savage, station super­
intendent.

Misses Gladyene Emmons and 
June Selmon, students of West 

i Texas State College, Canyon, 
: spent the week end in Clarendon 
visiting relatives and friends. 
Miss Bobby Emmons of Lubbock 
was also home for the weekend.

nontoir fo u n t »  Trader 12.11 r r .  In Coaatjr.

i4 T S U PER  PRICfs
•A;ir p
H i m\A

v<

Pure Lard A R M O U R S  
3 lb. Carton .69

SUGAR
Pure Cane— 5 lbs. 49 c
FLOUR
Gold Medal— 5 lbs.

PEACHES
Free Stone. Cal-Top— No. 2'/a 32c
ORANGE JUICE
Klmbellc— 46 oz. C a n ...........

f ia lita in e ,

COFFEE
HC0N0MY 1 Pound 

IN
• QUALITY” 89c

BAB-0
2 for .........

25c
JELL0
3 for 27c
MY-T-FINE
Pudding— 3 for . . . 29c

S o lit a ir e

HONEY
'ECONOMY 20 «*• 

IN
„ QUALITY* 39c

f Solitaire,
J  J E L L Y  3lC

BACON
D ry  Salt— 1 Pound

Solitaire,
HORSERADISH FLAVORED t l Z C

DRESSING

M A R K E T  V A L U E S• FRESH  V E G E T A B L E S
CHEESE
Longhorn— 1 Pound 49c CELERY

Large Kriap— 1 Pound 12c
BOLOGNA
CudahY'a all meat— 1 P o u n d ....... 52c LETTUCE

Large Firm— 1 Pound 13c
BANANAS
Golden Ripe— 1 Pound 15c

FAR M ER S E XC H A N G E
Phone 63-J GROCERY & MARKET We Deliver
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MISSION ACCOMPLISHED—USS Boxer’s (CV-21) helicopter 
lands on the flight deck after an air-sea rescue mission..

Tagged Ducks Help 
Scientists Determine 
Vital Facts About 
The Birds’ Habits

AUSTIN—During the last four 
winters about six hundred pin­
tail ducks have been banded in 
the Rdckport area, according to 
an article in “Texas Game & 
Fish," official publication of the 
Texas Game, Fish & 'Oyster 
Commission.

And data already compiled on 
the basis of returns made by 
hunters, who shot some of the 
tagged birds, has helped scien­
tists to determine vital facts 
about the birds’ habits.

These studies indicate nesting 
routine, the flyways used in 
moving from north to south, 
average ages and whether hunt­
ers are harvesting th e ' young 
produced each year or the breed­

ing stock.
Of the pintails banded at 

Rockport, 26 band returns have 
been received. Ten were killed 
within two miles or less of the 
original banding site; eight ad­
ditional were killed elsewhere 
in Texas, three in Nebraska, two 
in California, and one each in 
Alaska, North Dakota and Okla.

“Thus.” states the article, "we 
find about 38 per cent i.od re­
turned to the same wintering .site 
as occupied the year before. 
From a study of the additional 
band returns, we find that near­
ly all were traveling toward the 
Texas coast.

“An exception to this statement 
would be in those birds killed in 
Alaska, Nebraska and North Da­
kota. The two pintails killed in 
California fit into a recently de­
veloped theory of pintail migra­
tions from their nesting grounds 
in the north central United 
S:ates, and Alberta, Sasketche-
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wan and Manitoba, Canada, 
southward into Montana and 1 
North Dakota, westward into 
California, south into Mex'co, 
crossing to the Gulf coast, and 
northward again up the Central 
and Mississippi flyways. It is 
anticipated that additional bands 
from local pintails w ill be re­
turned from California.”

Health Notes
AUSTIN— “It has been well 

said that procrastination not only 
is the thief of time, but frequent­
ly the thief uf health and life,” 
Dr. Geo. W. Cox, State Health 
Officer, said today. “ Indeed, 
medical records in physicians’ of­
fices and hospitals prove that 
many persons die because they 
do not receive early diagnosjs 
and prompt treatjnent for their 
condition. An outstanding ex­
ample of this fact is the great 
number of deaths from tubercu­
losis that could have been pre­
vented.

“Tuberculosis is a powerful 
enemy, no matter what its stage, 
but the fact remains that early 
discovery and adequate treat­
ment offer the best opportunity 
for cure. I f  the patient upon be­
ing told that he has tuberculosis 
cioperates fully with the strict 
regimen and discipline outlined 
for him, the disease cart usually 
be overcome.”

Dr. Cox said that in lihe with 
some of the other major killers, 
tuberculosis is insidious in its ap­
proach.. Acute pain and discom­
fort are absent usually, and the 
symptoms are so comparatively 
mild that the patient is thrown 
o ff guard and considers them of 
little importance. Herein lies the 
real slaying ability of tubercu­
losis.

"The symptoms which, singly

W e Have Installed
A COMPLETERadiator

t -Repair Shop
TEXAS CROWD A'MIGHTY

To  an eagle fly ing overhead, this is the way the crowds at the State Fair o f Texas might have looked on opening day. 
The photograph shows only a small segment of the 187-acre, $35,000,000 fairgrounds, o f course. More than two m illion 
three hundred thousand people are expected to visit the fair this year. It ’s the w orld ’s biggest and best state fair.

or in combination, demand - an 
immediate checkup by the doctor 
are easy tiring, a persistent cough 
and continued loss of weight.

“While it is true that any of 
these symptoms can be present 
without the patient having tuber­
culosis, this is no reason to imag­
ine that such is the case. There­
fore, if one is suffering from any 
of these manifestations ,the only 
sensible and safe thing to do is 
seek the advice of the family 
physician at once,”  Dr. Cox 
warned. “ I f  such a course is pur­
sued, and the condition turns out 
to be not senous, nothing has 
been lost. On the other hand, if 
tuberculosis is discovered, the 
patient by doing the wisest pos­
sible thing has probably saved

his life.”

Baptist General 
Convention of Texas 
October 23-25th

D ALLAS—Thousands of Texas 
Baptists will gather in Houston 
October 23-25 for the 66th annual 
session of the Baptist General 
Convention of Texas.

"Christ for the World Now!” 
is the theme of the convention, 
which will be held in the Sam 
Houston Coliseum. William Flem- 

! ing, Fort Worth oilman, is the 
| layman-president of the conven- 
! tion.
I Speaker for the opening night

of the meeting, Tuesday, October 
23, is Dr. Duke K. McCall, Louis­
ville, Kentucky. Dr. McCall, for­
mer executive secretary of the 
Southern Baptist Convention, re­
cently accpted the position as 
president of the Southern Baptist 
Seminary, Louisville.

Other prominent Baptist lead­
ers included on the program are 
Dr. Courts Redford, assistant 
executive secretary of the South­
ern Baptist Home Mission Board. 
Atlanta, Ga.; Dr. J. Howard W ill­
iams, Dallas, Texas Baptist exe­
cutive secretary; Dr. J. D. Grey, 
New Orleans, president of the 
Southern Baptist Convention;

: and Billy Graham, probably the 
I outstanding evangelist of this 
generation.

Graham will be speaking for 
the second time* at an annual 
meeting of the Baptist conven­
tion. In 1950, he spoke to fourteen 
thousand Baptists in the W ill 
Rogers Coliseum in Fort Worth.

Meetings of the state Woman’s 
Missionary Union and men’s 
Brotherhood conventions will 
precede the General Convention 
on Monday and Tuesday, Octoter 
22 and 23. Mrs. R. L. Mathis and 
F. Ivy Boggs, both of Dallas, are 
the state presidents of the wom­
en’s and men’s organizations.

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Tyler of 
Amarillo and Mrs. Florine Ol- 
steen of Claude visited Sunday 
afternoon in the home of Mrs. E. 
W. Tyler.

WOULD YOU SIGN THE FOLLOWING
Being Operated by AGREEMENT?

✓

Seth Edens
Visit Our Complete Garage and Repair Shop 
next time you Need Good, Reliable Service

. AGREEM ENT

I G U A R A N TE E  TO  P A Y  for any injuries that my automobile may cause, whether it be to a 
person, or to a man’s property, real or personal, REGARDLESS OF W HETHER I A M  D n IV IN G  
IT, A N D  REGARDLESS OF W HETHER I AM  IN  THE C AR  A T  TH E T IM E  OF TH E A C C I­
DENT.

* In this I agree to pay all H O S P IT A L  B ILLS, DOCTOR B ILLS , COST OF JU D IC IA L  PRO ­
CEEDINGS, L A W Y E R ’S FEES, and A N Y  O TH ER COST OR EXPENSE, A S  W E LL  AS  A N Y  
JUDGMENT, REGARDLESS OF AM OU NT, that grows out o f any injury produced by my car,

AS  A  FURTH ER G U AR AN TE E  TO  TH IS  C O N TR A C T I PLED G E as SE C U R ITY  A L L  M Y  
R E A L ESTATE, Chattels, and propery of any kind which I now own; and I S T IL L  FURTHER 
G U AR AN TE E  to the performance of this contract, all real estate, personal, chattels, and property 
o f any kind, which I M A Y  HEREAFTER ACQU IRE . ACC U M U LATE , OR POSSESS.

S igna tu re.....................................................................

A  Public Liability and Property Damage Insurance Policy written at a 
very nominal cost with our agency would eliminate the obligations imposed 

by such an agreement.

A N  INSURANCE PO LICY  

TO FIT YO U R  NEED
AND

A  PA Y M E N T  PLA N  

TO FIT YO U R  BUDGET

LANE &. McCULLY
INSURANCE

Phon* 74
M A U R IC E  L A N E M IK E  M cC U L L Y

Goldston Bldg.

\ 
I.

I
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Mr. and Mrs. Otis Naylor and 
Robert visited Mr. and Mrs. S. H. 
Mahaffey Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Dane Perdue and 
Wynona spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Stout and Don at 
Fritch. They also visited at Bor­
der with Mr. and Mrs. Ben Talley 
and family.

Glenn Harvey of Wellington 
visited the Ben Lovells Thursday 
afternoon.

Charles Phiffer of Da'las came 
Monday for a visit with the John 
Whites and other friends here

this week.
Mr. and Mrs. G. L. Josey and

sons of Cotton Center spent Sat­
urday night with the A  J. Gar­
lands.

Mr. and Mrs. T. W. Duffel of 
Amarillo visited Mrs.' Myrtle 
Reed and sons Sunday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. H. E. Tolkson 
and Jeanelle spent Sunday with 
their son and family at Welling­
ton. A grand daughter, Elaine, 
came home with them for a 
week's stay.

•
Mr. and Mrs. James Reed Lov­

ell of Dumas visited the weekend 
with Mr. and M^s. Ben Lovell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Willard Cook and
Dean of Stinnett spent the week 
end with Mr. and Mrs. W. A. 
Poovev.

WHITE SWAN
W h ile  Swan C o ffe e  it 
b e l l i ‘t -H len J e J , to twit 
the coffee latte o f folk* 
here in the Southwest, 
w here c o ffe e  i t  b e t i!  
White Sw in 'i more ex­
pert blending meant extra 
enjoyment for you.

is America's 
finer coffee!

N O W — B igger V a lue  N y lon  Coupon in Every Pouodl

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Wallace and 
Patsy'shopped in Amarillo Satur­
day.

Mrs.' C. B. Harp was taken to
St. Anthony's Hospital in Ama­
rillo Monday night.

Bob Crawford was in Memphis 
Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Graham 
and Wanda went to Wellington 
Thursday for business and to 
visit relatives there.

Mr. and Mrs. Loyd Reid spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. J. F. 
White at Phillips.

Mr. and Mrs. H. S. Hardin 
made a business trip to Lubbock 
Wednesday. They were accompa­
nied by Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
Jones and Jackie Phelps.

New residents at the S. J. 
Ranch are Mr. and Mrs. O. T 
Lewis.

New officers were elected at 
Sunday school Sunday. They are 
as follows:

Supt., John White; Asst. Supt., 
Henry Wilson; Sec.-Treas., Patsy 
Wallace; Asst. Sec.-Treas., Bobby 
Wilson.

Each class will select their 
teacher this coming Sunday. 
Everyone is urged to be present. 
Mi's. Word and Mrs. Wilson have 
been making community calls in­
viting everyone to attend. Every 
person in the community is 
warmly invited to come to Jfcin-

Prize Texas ‘Chicks’

We also have al! models and sizes, electric­
ally operated as well as gas,' with no moving 
parts.

Mo moving parts to monkey with/

ft's.
f t ' s  m o t o r " 1

THE GREAT NEW SERVEL
. L ik e  m a ^ I o *

bigger inside, 
smaller outside

• -bo You’ll find lot* more use­
ful cold space . .  . yet the 
newServel fits in the some 
flooraron! You needn’t re­

model your kitchen to enjoy the com­
fort of extra roominess . . , two tem­
peratures in one refrigerator . . .  cold 
straight to the floor—with Serve!.

lo o k ! U  p to  70 pounds o f  
frozen  foods f it  in to  S er­
v e r s  new  2-cubic-foot 
F ree ze r  C om p artm en t.
Room for steaks, juices, 
vegetables—even ice cream by the gal 
Ion. Separate door seals cold inside.

ON THE LEFT, a Texas Blonde; 
on the right, a Texas Cross broil­
er. The first is weighing the sec­
ond which has been raised on 
antibiotic-supplemented feed. Us­
ing 45,000 of this type chicken 
(d eve lop ed  by crossing New  
H am ps h i r e s  and L e g h o rn s )  
Youngblood's Farm Of Waco re­
cently' completed a test on the 
“big four”  wonder drug antibiotics 
to discover the most efficient poul­
try feed supplement. Winner was

Bi - Con TM - 5, containing the 
wide-range antibiotic terramycin. 
The terramycin feed produced 
broilers for 15.06 cents a pound, 
while the three other feed supple­
ments ran costs per live pound 
up to 10.28, 16.59 and 16.84 cents 
each. Youngblood’s raises 3 mil­
lion chickens yearly. It* plants in­
clude breeding farmC hatchery, 
broiler plants, processing plant, 
feed mill, seven modern cafes 
plus a wholesale sales force.

day sc i jo! at Ashtola. They w il 
be through in time to attenc 
churches of their choice in Clar 
endon after Sunday school exer­
cises.

Mr. and Mrs. H. S. Hardin and 
Linda spent the weekend in Cor­
dell, Okla. visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Zerrol Denton.

Mrs. Millard Word attended the 
funeral of M. L. Mathers in 
Amarillo Wednesday.

Millard Word, Lester Harrelson 
and Leland Lewis attended a 
ranch roundup in Wichita Falls

L. P. (B ud ) Moore
WATER WELL DRILLER

CLARENDON, TEXAS 

Phone 292-W

7b firheir 
Misery of

C p ^ o o o
LIC

a k €
uomo on rt0i m  -  i w i  ■

Flip up the Quick- 
Change Shelves and 
nee how they adjust 
to make room for a 
giant turkey or water­

melon. Plenty of room for extra tall 
Vottles, too. It's quick, tt’s ensy.

Opsn the Bulldog 
Latch to Servel's 
Fresh Food Com­
partment. (Just a 
feather touch does 
it!) See the extra roominess. There’s 
even a special "Odds and Ends”  Tray.

Hearing Aid  
Authority Will 
Visit Clarendon

Mr. Reed Payne w ill be in 
Clarendon from 1 to 5 o’clock, 
Wednesday, October 17th to show 
the Hard of Hearing the latest 
progress that has been made In 
the hearing aid field. Mr. Payne 
w ill make free hearing tests and 
demonstrate the new Beltone 
Melody Hearing aid - - - will 
show you how you may hear 
dearly - - - and UNDERSTAND 
- - - with NO BUTTON SHOW­
ING IN  YOUR EAR!
For horns demonstration Phons 

Donley Hotel. No. 67 
Wednesday, October 17th 

Place: Donley Hotel
Batteries for all makes of aids.

Sponsored by 
Beltone Hearing Service 

117 West 6th S t. Amarillo

............
t o * ' * * *  • # n '

C o r n e d ® t U

vs& „
at your <loal«r<.

HOUSEHOLD SUPPLY COMPANY
COMPLETE HOME FURNISHINGS----- H O M E -O W N E D  and O PER ATED

"WE SERVICE AND REPJkJR ANYTHING WE SELL."

BUTANE A  PROPANE GAS SERVICE

^  T h e  T o i l e t r i e s  

x  M e n  P r e f e r

lInusua
e

in their superb quality 
and in their distinctive sure- 

grip pteksging . . . 'HIS' 
Fine Toiletries for Men 

meet every good grooming 
requirement.

$]00
tlUS TAX

After Shave Lotion,
Balanced Talcum, Cologne. 
Deodorant, Fine Hair Drcwi 

Before and After Electric 
Shave product!. Unite and 

gift acta. Si .00 to SlO.OO. 
*• Travel unita, >0c.

ng.

B O B  M OSS P H A R M A C Y  
Phona 36

Donley County Leader, $2.50 year

Tuesday.
Mr. and Mrs. Vance Gray and 

family visited his parents Friday 
to Sunday.

Mi-s. Hazel McDonald visited 
Mi-s. Myrne Rhoades last week.

Mrs. Word took her mother 
home to Canyon Sunday after a 
few days visit here.

SAINT M ARY'S 
CATHOLIC CHUitCH 
Rev. James Comiskey
Mass Every Sunday 

at 9:30 A. M.

METHODIST CHURCH 
Rov. John A. English, Pasto*

SUNDAY
Church School, 9:45 a. m. 
Morning Worship, 10:50 a. m. 
Intermediate F e l l o w s h i p ,  

6:30 p. m.
Methodist Youth Fellowship,

7:00 p. m.
Evening Worship, 7:30 p. I 

WEDNESDAY
Woman’s Society of Chrii 

Service, 3:30 p. m.
Homemakers’ Circle, Fo 

Wednesdays, 4:00 p. m.

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 
CHURCH

Robt. L. Cowan, D. D.. M i i
Sabbath school at 9:45 
Morning worship at 11 a. 
Evening Service at 7:30 p.

A  Welcome always.

M ARTIN  BAPTIST CHUR
Sunday School— 10:00 A.

Geo. Bulman, I 
Preaching Service— 11:00 l 
Training Union—7:30 P. f 

Frank Cannon, Dirt 
Preaching Service— 8:3# P 
Wednesday Evening P r s  

Service—7:30 P. M.
“The Church with a Frit 

Welcome.”

Donley Countv Leader. $2.50

N e v e r  B e f o r e - .

a i w t S i W ' i k e t h i

S t o p  Taking 
Harsh Drugs for 
C o n s t i p a t i o n

End Chronic Doting) Regain Normal 
Regularity Thit All-Vegetable Wayl

Taking harsh drugs for constipation can 
punish you brutally! Their cramps and 
griping disrupt normal bowel action, 
make you feel in need o f  repeated dosing.

When you occasionally feel constipated, 
get gentle but sun relief. Take Dt. Cald­
well's Senna Laxative contained in Syrup 
Pepsin. It's aH-rcgtlablo. N o  salts, no harsh 
drugs. Dr. Caldwell’s contains an extract 
o f  Senna, oldest and one o f  the finest 
natural laxatives known to medicine.

Dr. Caldwell's Senna Laxative tastes 
good, act* mildly, brings thorough relief 
comfortably. Helps you get regular, ends 
chronic dosing. Even relieves stomach
sourness that constipation often brings

M o n ty  back 
If not satisfied

M M  to So. 300 .
n . r. it. n . f.

OR. CALDWELL!
S E N N A  L A X A T I V I
Contained in ploaftant-tatting Syrup P e rw

SEE and KNOW these new  tire and tube advance 
—now available to you I

The U .S . ROYAL MASTER
With fhraa Uvea In ana
With ran*wabla (Total Traad Depth)

Stopping power and skid protection
for all-year driving safety.

the U .S .N Y LO N  LIFE-TUBE
Strong at a tire I
Prevents blowouts before they
happen!

You con actually demonstrate many of tf

With the Nylon hug and g 
punctures I
Outlasts many sot* at tlresl

OUR CREDIT SERVK
■fill K I. S. ROYALS vary issy to
Should you need new tMM 
tubes, or want them after yo« 
•sen this great 0 . S. ffO ’ 
SHOW—our allowances far ■ 
old tiro! and our long EASY CR 
TERMS malm U. S. Royalt »<trw 
oasy to awa.

se?y£03
feature, you r.o ff —  COME IM *

Patterson Service Station
Dude Cornell U . Z. Patterson

,V

Here's why Fordomafic 
puis them all in the pas
For the past y e a r , automotive w riters, engineers and ow ners have beee  
raving about a  new  kind of automatic driving . . .  
and here ’s w hy you get It 
only In Ford Cars;

All thu p o w e r yo u  n e e d  w h en  yo u

The automatic drivo toma can offer you b a 
'o rqu . converter which muHiplie. torque with­
out the uw o f gear.. It. advantage b  a smooth 
how o f power. It. dbodvontaga b a  .mailer 
range o f torque multiplication which require, 
more power from the engine and an uneco­
nomical axle ratio which increaiei coif.

A m s / w l t m i h f e A t i t i t f e

Other cars offer an automatic drive that use. 
automatic gears (as illustratsd In timpUflsd 
form al right) imtsad o f a torque converter. 
The advantage here b more “ go,”  more con­
trol and greater economy. The disadvantage 
I. that thh iy.tem b not as smooth, nor a. 
jsrk-free a . a torque converter.

Sm  Mr

It g iv e s  you instant1 
It practically d riv e s

B u f fo n to n ^

torque converter | 
gears. H bring, 
advantages o f both < 

UnIHrs can with on 
convertor (which Pah 
oil In on# drivo go 
motlc .tort, fa il am 
Intsrmediats Gear 
it i.lf into Drlvs Goa

Palmer M otor Compan
FORD SALES A SERVICE
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*  LE L IA  LA K E  *
$ Mr*. H. R. ilng X
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ I

Mr. and Mrs. D. E. Leathers 
visited relatives in Memphis last 
Sunday. y

Mrs. Luther Butler and Mari­
lyn, Mrs. Elmer Dishman and 
Anne shopped in Amarillo last 
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Emory Morris of 
Pampa visited her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. W. B. Ayers Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Roberts of 
Amarillo spent the weekend with 
Mr. and Mrs. Luther Butler.

Mrs. Arthur Dutton returned 
Thursday from a visit in Welling­
ton with Mr. and Mrs. E. J. Myers 
and children. Linda Myers ac­
companied her home for a visit.

Mr. and Mrs. James Smith at­
tended the funeral of Mrs. Billy 
Salmon in Brice Saturday. '

Mrs. B. J. Leathers went to 
Amarillo last Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Reynolds re­
turned from Okla. City last week, 
after spending a month with Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmy Pattillo and 
children.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Tomlinson 
and Donna spent the weekend in 
Plainview as guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. L. B. Chunn.

Mrs. D. E. Leathers shopped in 
Amarillo Monday.

Mrs. Anderson of Vernon left

See it/  O/rneit/ Buy it/
AMERICA'S THRIFTIEST HIGH-POWERED CAR

sod other apecifixation* subject to chance without notice.

i t 's  j e t -n t r f a m e d

in lookt and performance

/2>Ok.p. Stude/>aJoeAs 
C /m uftcuufa/u !/~8

Best 8 
in gas-saving
in M o b ilg e s  E c o n o m y  Run

Far advanced new type  
of V-8 engine!
Lightning-fast pick up!
Terrific zip on h ills!
No premium fuel needed!
A  bargain buy for anyone!
18 months to p ay!
Extra m arvtlota! SluJabahtr Automatic D riva! Shifts fa r itstif-ua  dutch pedal! Extra cast-ami worth it I

NOBLITT SALES CO.
Highway 287

in the 1951 Mobilgas Economy 
Run, a Studeboker Commander 
V-8 led a ll other competing  
eights in actual mites per gallon I

Stwdebeker •vtra.'iv*. optional at eatra coat, wo* used

HELICOPTER SERVES UNLIMITED
MISSIONS IN COMBAT IN KOREA

Prior to the Korean operations, the helicopter was generally con­
sidered an oddity, an infant among the battle-tested lighters, bombers 
and transport planes. During the interim period following World 
War II, it was used chiefly for air-sea rescues, reconnaissance and

mapping,a limited 
mean\ of trans­
porting personnel 
and equipment, 
crop dusting and 
various military 
operational ex­
periments. With 
the outbreak of 
the Korean ag­
gression, the heli­
copter loomed to 
the fore as one of 
the most versatile 
planes in combat. 
Because of its 
m aneu verability 
in remote and in­
accessible areas it 
has been used ex­
tensively in the 
evacuation of cas­
ualties and rescue 
of isolated troops 
as well as the re­
covery of critical 
equipment. Thou­
sands of fighting 
men ow e  their 
lives to this type 
o f  evacuation. 
Specially designed

j .............. equipment pro­
duced In limited quantities and vital to the United Nations operations 
have been retrieved and returned to our forces. Safe shipment of 
highly essential equipment and supplies is most generally assured.

Its unique sire and the low altitude at which it flies makes it a 
difficult target for the enemy and a very effective forward observer 
and artillery spotter for ground troops. Field commanders are using 
it extensively for closer liaison with their tactical positions and troops. 
The armed services are anticipating many more uses for the aerial 
curiosity with additional field tests and certain modifications.

Tuesday after a visit with her son 
Cap Anderson and family.

Guy Murphy, who has been 
stationed at Fort Sill, Okla. is 
spending a furlough here with 
his mother, Mrs. Evelyn Murphy 
and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Tony Radietch of 
Los Angeles, Calif, visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Sid Pointer last week.

Mrs. Arthur Dutton visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Ellis of Plaska Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Dub Smith and 
children and Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Robert Leathers and children re­
cently returned from a visit with 
relatives in Dallas.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Fox and 
daughters were called to Abilene 
Sunday by the illness of Mrs. 
Billy Moreland. They were ac­
companied by Sue Seago.

The Donley County Singing 
met at the Methodist Church 
Sunday. Out of town visitors 
were Mr. and Mrs. Joe Craw-

Added Attractions At 
Prison Rodeo Opener 
Sunday, October 7

HUNTSVILLE — Texas’ No. 1 
Citizen, Governor Allan Shivers, 
will be guest of honor at the 
opening performance of the 20th 
Annual Prison Rodeo. In his 
honor Sunday, October 7, has 
been designated as Governor’s 
Day at the show.

Added attractions for the 1951 
show are many and heading the 
list is the nation’s top balladeer, 
Eddy Arnold. The Tennessee

Plowboy. America’s No. 1 sing­
er of folk songs w ill be accom­
panied by steel guitarist, Roy 
Wiggins, and make his appear­
ance on Governor’s Day only.

Other top musical stars of 
radio are scheduled for the re­
maining three Sundays of the 
famous convict rodeo. Guy Willis 
and his Oklahoma Wranglers will 
play at the second show. October 
14th. Curly Fox, America’s 
Champion Old-Time Fiddler, and 
Miss Texas Ruby are billed for 
the third and fourth shows, 
October 21st and 28th.

O f course, the toughest riders 
from behind the “ Walls” w ill pit 
their skills against the roughest, 
wildest livestock that ever roam­
ed the prison system’s vast river- 
bottom ranges.

Between convict riding events. 
Miss Huguette, famous French 
equestrienne, w ill put her fam­
ous dancing horse, Glamour Doc, 
through his paces. There w ill be 
trick riding, calf roping and 
other specialty acts.

From .ae time the gates swing 
open on the suicidal Mad Scram­
ble, the opening event, ’til the 
end of the riotous Chariot Race, 
that close the show, there’s never 
a dull moment. It ’s two hours 
packed with thrills no other 
rodeo can equal. So make your 
plans to attend the show now.

Send your check or money 
order by mail or w ire to L. J. 
Craig, Prison Ticket Office, 
Huntsville for your reservations. 
They’re $2.40 each, tax included.

Mr. and Mrs. T. W. McMasters 
and daughter Mollie Jo of Porter­
field, Calif, were guests Friday 
night in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Tyler.

ford of Amarillo, Mrs. Roy Clark 
and daughter and Clarence Mer­
rick of Groom.

Mr. and Mrs. Wallace Smith 
and children of Amarillo spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. H-mry 
Parker.

Mr. and Mrs. George Johnston 
and Joyce spent Sunday in Good­
night as guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jake Johnston.

Mr. and Mrs. John Hansard and 
girls spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. J. E. White and children.

Lt. Don Cain of Dallas visited 
in Clarendon a few hours Tues­
day. Lt. Cain was a class mate of 
J. E. Thompson’s in Texas Uni­
versity law school. He is a War II 
veteran and has recently return­
ed from 24 months service in the 
Korean war, with the Navy over 
there. He was enroute to Pampa 
where he will be associated with 
the Rogers-Thompson law firm

TOP C O ATS

from

$ 27.50

S K E L T O N ’ S
TH E A P P A R E L  STORE

You’ll find a wide selection of fur- 

niture pieces and suites that are de­

signed for your particular needs at

CLARENDON
FURNITURE
COMPANY

t e l r i i E i f c j r J m
D  — - k i i m
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CLARENDON 
FOOD STORE

APRICOTS
Hunts. WJiole. No. 2'A Cans— 2 for 59c CORN

Hunts, whole kernel. No. I Cans— 8 for
$100 BERRIES

Hunts. No. 2 Cans— 3 for

APRICOTS
Hunts. Whole, No. 300 Cans— 5 for

$100 CHILI SAUCE
Hunts, 12 oz. Bottles— 5 for

$100 DILL PICKLES
Hunts. 8 oz. Jars— 3 for

ASPARAGUS
Hunts. A ll Green. No. 1 Cans— 3 for

$100 CUCUMBER CHIPS
Hunts. 12 oz. Jars— 4 for 59c FRUIT COCKTAIL

Hunts. No. 2‘/i Cans— 3 for

$ 1 0 0

43 c
$100

\ PEACHES H U NTS

H A LVE S

No. 2 Va Cana—4 for $1.00
C A T S U P HU NTS

14 oz. Bottles— 5 for
>

FRUIT COCKTAIL
Hunts. 300 size— 4 Cans

$100
GREEN BEANS $|60
Hunts. Cut, No. 2 Cans— 5 for

GREEN BEANS $100
Hunts. Cut, No. 1 Cans— 7 for

PEACH PRESERVES $100
Hunts. 1 lb. Jars— 4 for

PEACHES
Hunts..Sliced, No. 2 Vi Cans— 4 for

$100
PEARS
Hunts. Halvas. No. 2 Vi Cans— 2 for 79c
PEARS
Hunts. Halves. 3C0 size— 4 for

5 1 M

The best place to make a dollar go further is at your friendly Clarendon 
Food Store. W ith our annual Hunts Trainload Sale in fu ll swing, you can 
buy more for less money than ever before.

W e are now affiliated with the Panhandle Associated Grocers Association 
allowing us to buy in larger quantities and for less. Take advantage of these 
savings that w e are passing on to you during this great sale.

Come in today and register for a new Buick and fill your shopping basket 
w ith Dollar Stretching merchandise. W o appreciate tL* wonderful cus­
tomers of Our store and the best way wc know to show our appreciation is 
to o ffer these savings to you.

You must bo 16 years old or over to register for a Buick automobile. 

ONE winner to a family. Register during the next 1C days.

—

PEAS
Hunts, 300 size— 6 Cans

POTATOES i
Hunts, New, 300 size— 10 Cans

$ ] M

$ ] M

SPINACH
Hunts. No. 2 Cans— 8 for

$100
PRESERVES
Hunts, Strawberry, 1 lb. Jars— 3 for

$100

TOMATO SAUCE
Hunts. 8 oz. Cans— S for 4 9  c
TOMATOES
Hunts. Solid Pack. 300 size— S for

$1 00

TOMATO JUICE
Hunts, 300 size— 10 Cans

$ 1 1 1

i 1

f h I Li 89
H U NTS

46 oz. Cans— 4 for .00
APPLES
N ew  Crop Fancy Delicious— Pound

GRAPES ~
Tokays— Pound .................................

CARROTS
Large Bunches— 2 for

15c
i © c

19c

PEAS—Blackeyes $1SS
Shurfine. 300 size— 8 Cans

CHERRIES—Shurfine $100
Red Sour Pitted, No. 2 Cans— 4 for

HOMINY 5100
Shurfine, 300 size— 11 Cans

FRESH DRESSED

HENS and FRYERS
ROAST
Fresh Pork— Pound 39c
OLEO
Sun Spun— Pound 23c

Clarendon Food
W E DELIVER W E G IVE  G U N N  BROS. THRIFT STAM PS PH ONE 43

"
A::. t'.
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LES BEAUX ARTS CLUB
The Les Beaux Arts Club met 

Friday afternoon at the Patching 
Club House with Mrs. Lloyd 
Benson, hostess. Mrs. C. T. Mc- 
Murtry presided over the busi­
ness session.

A  most interesting program on 
Handicrafts was presented by 
Mrs. Pete Kunz, program leader, 
nssisted by Mrs. W. J. Lewis, Jr. 
Hand work of all kinds were on 
exhibit including quilts,' linens, 
various leather crafts, ceramics, 
paintings, and copper and alum­
inum serving trays. Works were 
displayed from several foreign 
countries, Mexico, Chile, Italy 
and the Philippines rounding out 
a unique program.

Refreshments were served to 
Mesdames Walter Taylor, C. C. 
Powell, W. C. Thorn berry, W. H. 
Patrick, Emmet Simmons, J. D. 
Swift, Frank Phelan, Jr., C. T. 
McMurtry, W. K. Hardin, Tom­
my Saye, Pete Kunz, W. J. Lewis, 
Jr., by the hostess, Mrs. Benson.

McCAULEY—KAH N
Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Hahn are 

at home near Ashtola after their 
wedding trip. They were married 
Sept. 15 at Burlington, North 
Carolina. Mrs. Hahn is the former 
Ruth McCauley of Burlington. 
Mr. Hahn is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. E. P. Hahn and has been a 
resident of Donley County a 
number of years.

MOTHERS STUDY CLUB
Mothers Study Club met Tues­

day afternoon, Oct. 9, at Patching 
Club House with Mrs. Louise 
Wiley presiding, in the absence of 
Francis McCord, president. Seven 
active members answered roll 
call with two guests present. The 
annual children’s Halloween 
party was punned. Mrs. Naomi 
Green will be hostess, the grout/

iH E  DONKEY COUNTY LEADER

PIN K  AND BLUE SHOWER
Mrs. Grady Tyler was honored 

with a stork shower Saturday 
afternoon, October 6, in the home 
of Mrs. Ed Speed. Hostesses were 
Mesdames Ed Speed, Bob Head, 
and Troy Guy. Many lovely gLft§ 
were received by the honoree.

Delicious refreshments of pink 
ice cream and blue cake were 
served to approximately 17
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ENGAGEMENT
ANNOUNCED

Mr. and Mrs. C. B. Morris an­
nounce the apprnsening marriage 
o f their daughter, Mae, and j 
Dwayne Naylor, son of Mr. and j 
Mrs. Royce Hall. Vows w ill be 
exchanged at 9 o’clock Saturday 
morning at the Methodist Church.

for the j guests.

ASHTOLA NEEDLE CLUB
The Club met at 10 o’clock with 

18 members and visitors present, 
with Vena Hudson as hostess. A  
delicious covered dish luncheon 
was served at noon.

Two quilts were quilted for the 
Boys Ranch. Mrs. Harp volun­
teered to hem the quilts and de­
liver them.

A t 2:30 Ivan Tollerson held a 
short business session, opened 
with a prayer by Vena Hudson. 
Arrangements were made for the 
Club to serve lunch at Mr. Bar­
bee’s Dairy Sale Oct. 18. Each 
member is to furnish and bring to 
the sale ana help serve two pies 
and 1 large loaf of bread made 
into sandwiches. We will also 
serve drinks of coffee and pop. 
Each member please try to be 
present to help serve the lunch.

The next meeting was to be 
O ct 18, but on account of the sale 
the meeting has been changed to 
O ct 16. It Is to be Guest Day with 
a Book Review. Ima Wallace and 
Charlotte Word will be hostesses.

—Reporter.

-s S O A P  D E A L. % * % *
I Large Box Each o f DUZ. TIDE. DREFT.
3 Bars Personal Ivo ry  and 1 large metal Waste Basket

All fo r .... $ J 59

PAPER TOWELS
Super Dry— 2 Rolls 43c
WESSON OIL
Quart Bottle 63 c
TOMATOES
Diamond Brand. No. 2 Cans— 2 for 35c
SALMON
Brlm iull— Tall Can

TUNA FISH
Brimfull, Fancy white meat— 2 Cans 73c
TAMALES
Armours Star— 1 lb. Can

APPLE JELLY
Western Maid— Quart Jar

GRAPE JAM
Western Maid— Quart Jar 47c
DOG MEAT
Ideal or K6n-L Ration— 6 Cans 95c

B R IN G  U S  Y O U R  S O A P  C O U P O N S

We give S&H Green Stamps

W. E. CLIFFORD
Grocery Sc Market

8 W e D ells

to go to her farm home 
part-/. Oct. 23.

Mrs. Nova Lee Mooring’s name 
was presented for membership to 
be voted upon at the next meet­
ing. Mrs. Phylis Dale, Mrs. Frieda 
Gray, Mrs. Bobbie Lowry, Mrs. 
Betty Vick, Mrs. Lois Marie 
Moore and Mrs. Evelyn Preacher 
are new members in the,club.

“Children’s Literature” was the 
program subject. Mrs. Mae 
Prewitt, City Librarian, prepared 
an interesting paper on “What 
the Children Read” which was 
read to the club by Pauline 
Heath.

Hostesses for the meeting were 
Annese Bennett and Bobbie 
Lowry who served lovely re­
freshments to Lois Marie Moore, 
Nova Lee Mooring, Billie Jean 
Moore, Evelyn Preacher, Louise 
Wiley, Betty Vick and Pauline 
Heath.

FAM ILY  NIGHT
Family night was observed 

Wednesday night, Oct. 4, at the 
Presbyterian Church with a 
buffet supper. Members of the 
church gathered at the church at 
7 P. M., bringing their covered 
dish.

Mrs. J. G. Stewart, chairman 
of Christian Education, gave in  
outline of the work- within the 
Church, calling upon the indi­
vidual teachers, who gave their 
plan of study for the next 3 
month period. Dr. Cowan gave a 
short talk on “Christian Educa­
tion, within the Family.” The 
program was well attended.

M ID W AY CLUB
The Midway Club met with 

Ellen Moreland. A  delicious lunch 
was served and the day was 
spent quilting.

Members present were Lucille 
Eanes, Roxie Williams, A llie 
Quattlebaum, Sarah Shaller, Ar- 
rie Hefner, Eddie Williams, 
Goldie Mooring, Norma Cham­
berlain, Vada McCrary, Jonnie 
Hill, Loyd Hillis, Ida Pickering, 
Nell Land and Ellen Moreland.

During the business meeting 
all the officers were re-elected.

The next meeting will be with 
Ida Pickering October 18.

— Reporter.

GOLDSTON QUILTING CLUB
The Goldston Quilting Club 

met with Kattie Scoggins, Wed., 
Oct. 3. One quilt was almost fin­
ished. Those present were Ola 
McBrayer, Blanch Gray, Sarah 
Peggram, May Pearl McDonald, 
Oddie Moss, Billie Ashcraft, 
hostess Kattie Scoggins and new 
member Madeline Philley. -  

The next quilting will be with 
Oddie Moss, Wed,, Oct. 17.

— Reporter.

n u n m c s
From tlw Court? PMA Committn

BIRTHDAY CLUB
The Birthday Club met Thurs­

day in the home of Mrs. J. I. 
Spurgeon, honoring her on her 
birthday. A  covered dish lunch­
eon was served at the noon hour 
with visiting and needlework 
the program of the afternoon. 
About 25 members and guests at­
tended. Mrs. Spurgeon received 
many lovely gifts.

Out-of-town guests were Mrs. 
Doris Gregory, Mrs. Bob Hutson 
a.id Mrs. Bill Butler, all of Bor- 
ger. »

M ARTIN  QUILTING CLUB
The Martin Quilting Club met 

October 4 with Nola Hill with 11 
members and 2 visitors present. 
Margaret Waldrop and Yvonne 
Barker received pollyanna gifts. 
Lunch was served at the .noon 
hour to Lela Bulman, Blanch 
Higgins, Bessie Helton,
Jordan, Lizzie Morrow, Alleen 
Talley, Margaret Waldrop, Lois 
Sibley, Sallie Christie, Eunice 
Land, Nita Fancher, Mrs. A. J. 
Sibley and the hostess Nola Hill.

The next meeting will be with 
Sallie Christie, Oct. 18.

— Reporter.

PM A COMMITTEE 
ELECTIONS ANNOUNCED

PM A farmer-committee elec­
tions will be held in Texas dur­
ing November 1 to November 23, 
B. F. Vance, Chairman of the 
State PM A Committee, announc­
ed. These elections will be held 
in each of the 1468 designated 
agricultural communities in the 
State.

In each community, a PM A 
community committee, consisting 
of three regular members and 
two alternates, and a delegate to 
a county convention will W  elect­
ed. At a succeeding county con­
vention the delegates will elect 
a county committee, consisting of 
a chairman, vice-chairman, mem­
ber and two alternates. County 
conventions must be held by 
November 29. Newly elected 
committeemen will take office 
December 1, 1951.

Tlie committeemen elected at 
this time will administer the 1952 
Production and Marketing Ad­
ministration programs In thefr 
respective counties and com­
munities. These PM A  programs 
include the agricultural conser­
vation program, price support 
operations, and the sugar pro­
gram. Currently PM A commit-* 
tees also have many responsibili­
ties in connection with defense 
activities, and with field opera­
tions of the Federal Crop Insur­
ance Corporation.

Any farmer who is participat­
ing in any of these programs is ,

Meeting To Explain 
New Building Orders

All area builders^ including 
general contractors, electrical, 
heating, plumbing contractors, 
owners, building suppliers, city 
and county officials, including 
schools, or others interested in 
construction whether it be a resi­
dence or public or private build­
ing, are urged by the Lubbock 
USDC-NPA Office and Claren­
don Chamber of Commerce to at­
tend a meeting at the City Hall 
in Clarendon, Oct. 11 at 2:30 p. <n.

G. S. King, Industrial Analyst 
in the District Office of the Na­
tional Production Authority from 
Lubbock will be on hand to ex­
plain the new orders. The entire 
construction i n d u s t r y  w a s  
brought under the controlled 
material plan October 1, 1951. 

j The order does apply to both 
public and private construction.

At the meeting such questions 
will be discussed as what build­
ing may be commenced now, 
may a building now under con­
struction continue with such con­
struction, what construction re­
quires authorization from NPA, 
quantities of controlled materials 
that may be used in construction 
and many other questions relat­
ing to the new construction order. 
Specific questions will be ans­
wered in an open session at the 
close of the meeting.

The meeting will be open to 
any and all interested persons 
from this area.

COUNTY AND AREA 
SUPERINTENDENTS IN 
NATIONAL MEETING

The National County Superin­
tendents and Area Superintend­
ents meeting was held in Dallas
beginning Sept. 29 and continu­
ing thru October 3rd. There were 
660 county Superintendents from 
over the United States registered 
representing 38 states.

The program was reported to 
be outstanding in every respect. 
Vesper services were held Sun­
day night; a rodeo Saturday 
night at Mesquite, Texas delight­
ed those from the east. Monday 
night a Square dance provided 
the entertainment with a ban­
quet on Tuesday night. Wednes­
day noon the States Luncheon 
was held. A ll this combined with 
10 group meetings and such able 
speakers as Dr. McFarland, Pub­
lic Relations representative for 
General Motors, of Topeka, Kan­
sas, and Dr. Norman Frost, head 
of the Education department of 
Peabody College, Nashville, 
Tenn. completed the program.

The meeting next year will be 
held in New York City. Ruth 
Richerson, Donley County School 
Superintendent and Mary Fore­
man of Memphis attended from 
this area. They returned home 
Thursday.

RESIGNS JOB AT 
SCS OFFICE

Jackie Phelps, an employee of 
the Soil Conservation Sendee the 
last 4*4 years, resigned this week, 
according to Carman Rhode in 
charge of the local office.

Changes in administrative pro­
cedures of the Soil Conservation 
Service to increase efficiency of 
operations resulted in the move­
ment of her duties to the Pampa 
Work Group Office. Mrs. Phelps 
elected to resign rather than to 
be transferred to Pampa.

"Mrs. Phelps has been a cap­
able and efficient employee and 
it is with regret we lose her from 
the Soil Conservation Service 
Rhode slated.

G IRL SCOUTS ATTEND 
STATE FAIR

The troop of Girl Scouts under 
the leadership of Mrs. Harold 
Longan and Mrs. Roy Crutch­
field attended the State Fair in 
Dallas the week end. They left 
by train Friday night returning 
to Clarendon Sunday morning. 
Those making the trip were the 
leaders and Joyce Crutchfield, 
Paula Skelton, Margaret Cushing, 
Carolyn Thomas. Shirley Chilton, 
Wanda Lewis, Marianne Longan, 

eligible to vote in the election I Mary Francis McCully, Marion 
held in his community. Places j Martin and Harlcne Smith, 
and dates of elections in each j Jackie Estlack joined the group 
community will be announced by j in Dallas for Saturday morning, 
the county PMA committee later. : A ll report a most enjoyable time 
USEFULNESS OF COVER , and are looking forward to an-

ATTEND STATE FAIR
A  number of F.H.A. girls and 

their sponsor, Loyd Richerson 
attended the State Fair in Dallas 
the week end leaving by train 
Friday night. Girls making the 
trip were Willetta Riney, Evelyn 
Wood, Shirley Martin, LaVelle 
Hodge, Kay Schollenbarger and 
Gcnella Mooring. Three F.F.A. 
boys also made the trip, Bill 
Noblet, Ronnie Martin and Char­
les Roberts.

. and S O C I A L  S E C U R I T Y
Students w 1k > have given up 

summer jobs to return to school 
should put their social security 
account number cards in a safe 
place until they are again need­
ed. That is the advice o f John R. 
Sanderson, manager of the Ama­
rillo social security office.

The card and number used this 
year, for perhaps the first time, 
will be the same one usd for the 
balance of the individual’s work­
ing lif.

Next summer, or, during the 
Christmas holidays, the student 
asking for a job w ill again be re­
quested to show his social secur­
ity number. Many employers w ill 
not hire a person unless he has 
his social security card with him.

A  lost or misplaced account 
number card may mean delay in 
going to work and could mean 
the loss of a job opportuhjty: The 
Amarillo office can replace lost 
cards, but it takes time. Tlie ac­
count number card should be 
safeguarded and shown to each 
new employer on the day the 
employee starts work. Correct 
benefit payments at retirement 
age or at death depend entirely 
on correct reporting o f the name, 
account number and wages by 
every employer.

NOW IN JAPAN
Mrs. T. A. Sullivan recently re­

ceived a telegram from her son 
Pvt. William T. Sullivan, stating 
that he had arrived in Tokyo 
Sept. 19th. Sullivan entered the 
service in April of this year and 
is with the 85th Infantry division.

Mildred Long of Amarillo was 
a week end guest in the home o f 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike McCully and
family.

Mr. and Mrs. L. N. Pittman and 
children of An urillo were week 
end guests ir. the home of his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. M. L. Pittman.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob McCoy of 
San Francisco, Calif, are visiting 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. A. H 
Moore. They arrived Sunday for 
their first visit home in 6 years. 
Mr. McCoy is a practicing attor­
ney-at-law in San Francisco. 
Other Sunday guests in the 
Moore home included Mr. and 
Mrs. Doyle Walls and Brenda 
from Floydada; Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
Moore and Terry and Mr. and 
Mrs. James Moore and Danny.

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Risley an­
nounce the arrival o f u son at 
Goodall Hospital in Memphis, 
October 4th. The young man, 
named James Kevin, weighed 
7 lbs.

Mrs. A. H. Moore, Don and 
Jack and Mr. and Mrs. Bob Mc­
Coy of Snn Francisco, Calif, 
were Amarillo visitors Tuesday.

CROPS EXPANDING
Cover crops are becoming im­

portant in an ever-expanding 
area.

For a long time, cover crops 
have bebn grown in p..rts of the 
Sobth where the soil freezes little 
in the winter time. Their tenac­
ious roots hold the soil from be- 

Ruby] ing washed away by the heavy 
rains. When the cover crop had 
done that job, it was turr

other such trip.

ENTERTAIN W ITH 
CANASTA

Mr. nnd Mrs. Ed Mahaffey of 
near Ashtola entertained his 
mother, Mrs. Mahaffey, and
a number of m r friends Tuesday 
with “canasta” games and a real 
feast at the noon hour.

T! lose present were Mmes. Tom 
Cordcr, Crabtree, Lela Griggs, 
Edith Longan, J. C. Estlack, Har­
ley Longan and her sons Ronnie 
arjd Phillip. *

Mrs. Mahaffey expects to re­
turn soon to her home in Down­
ing, Calif.

NAMED DEPUTY GRAND 
CHANCELLOR

Aljen Harp, 100 Judicial Dis­
trict Attorney, has been named 
deputy grand chancellor for the 
Knights of Pythias in 21st dis­
trict.

The announcement of the ap­
pointment was made recently by 

d un-| Grand Chancellor James Pulasota

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Burt of 
Waco visited in the home of his 
sister, Mrs. Leek Goldston last 
week.

Dr. and Mrs. J. W. Evans and 
her sister. Miss Katherine Ross, 
returned home last week after 
visiting his sisters, Mrs. D. R. 
Gordon at Abilene, Kansas, and 
Miss Hattie Evans at St. Louis,
A T ’ ‘  %M issouri.

CLUB BOARD
The Patching Club House 

Board met Monday afternoon at 
3 o’clock at the Club House. Mrs. 
W. J. Lewis, Jr., president, pre­
sided. Problems pertaining to the 
Club House and improvements to 
be made were discussed.

Those present were Mesdames 
W. J. Lewis, Jr., J. G. Stewart, 
M. C. Rampy, W. J. Williams, R. 
A. William*, T. G. W iley ,, Roy 
Blackman, PYank Phelan, Jr., and 
Lloyd Benson.

Mr. and Mrs. Denton Moore of 
Shamrock visited in the Leek 
Goldston home over the weekend.

der to make way for a row crop. 
Now they have expanded into the 
North where the soil fieezcs hard 
in the winter.

Even though Northern soil 
freezes in the winter it washes 
away in the spring. For this rea­
son continuously cultivated soils 
have lost much of their organic 
matter and nitrogen. Cover crops 
are now coming in to help hold 
such soil in place, build up the 
organic matter, improve the 
structure and increase the nitro­
gen. Hairy Vetch and rye have 
made the best showing.

Cover crops also arc important 
because they lengthen the graz­
ing season. In the South, where 
the winter isn’t severe, cover 
crops have stretched out the graz­
ing season to 12 months. As far 
North as New Jersey the pasture 
season is lengthened from 5 to 7

of tlie Grand Lodge of Texas.

weeks in the 2nd 2 to 3 weeks
in the spring. 9 total of 7 to 10 
weeks added grazing.

American farmers and ranchers 
have been able to produce great 
quantities of food and fiber by 
hard work and individual thrift. 
Thrift has provided the capital

pare for future expansion now. 
Invest part of your income in the 
safest investment in the world. 
BUY U. S. DEFENSE BONDS.

Mrs. G. W. Bradshaw and 
children visited the week end 
with relatives at Hereford.

ABSENTEEISM •
STILL HIGH

The absentee count in the local 
schools is still high and school of­
ficials are still hoping for a 
change for a smaller number. The 
total absentee days recorded last 
week for all grades was 114V4. 
The cost to the school was 
$103.05. T l’.e two lower grade 
schools recorded 60 days and the 
senior high hud 54 v4 days.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Alderson and 
Gene spent the week end at Dal­
las and attended the State Fair 
Saturday. They returned home 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Bert Smith. J i. 
and children who live on Lake 
Texhoma, near Marietta, Okla. 
canie Tuesday to spend a few 
days with relatives here.

Donley County Leader, $2.50 yea1

MULKEY 
THEATRE

L A S T  TIM ES F R ID A Y  
October 12th

RANDOLPH SCOTT
-»n-

99“ Fort Worth
in Technicolor

S A T U R D A Y  O N L Y  
October 13th

RICARDO M O NTALBAN 
and CYD CHARISSE

— in—
a Mark of The

Renegade
in Technicolor

99

ACCEPTED FOR OC3
Jimmy Howze, 'son of Mr. and 

Mrs. J. H. Howze,* has received 
notice that he has been accepted 
for Officers Candidate School 
following basic training with 
the Fifth Armored Division at 
Camp Chaffee, Arkansas. He 
graduated from Austin College in 
Sherman in the spring and has 
been making his home in Claren­
don since that time.

Mr. and Mrs. A. H. Moore, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Moore, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bud Moore, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob McCoy of San Francisco, 
Calif., Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Walls 

to help agriculture expand. Pre- (oof Floydada met at Long Champs
in Amarillo Wednesday evening 
for dinner. The occasion honored 
Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Walls on 
their 3rd wedding anniversary. *

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Bell and 
girls of Borger visited relatives 
here the week end.

Mr. and Mi's. Bob McCoy of 
San Francisco arrived Sunday to 
visit her parents, Mr.’ and Mrs. A
H. Moore and family.

Mrs. Bob Head returned Sun­
day from Dallas where she visit­
ed her daughter, Mr.-and Mrs. 
Tom Haefcr, Jr.

Mrs. Wm. S. Greene and child­
ren visited Thursday with her 
parents, , Mr. and Mrs. J. O. 
Adams at Leslie.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Butler and 
Chester of Claude were guests 
Sunday in the home of his par­
ents, Mi-, and Mrs. Clyde Butler.

Mrs. L. R. Dean of Amarillo 
visited friends and attended to 
business here the first of the 
week.

Mr. and Mrs. W. C. Smith of 
Bay City visited last week with 
his sister, Mrs. Buster Emmons 
and family.

Mr. and Mrs. W. C. Larimer 
and Mrs. Dick Allan visited in. 
Amarillo Saturday.

S U N D A Y  and M O N D A Y

October 14-15th 
D ANNY KAYE 

and GENE TIERNEY

“ On Tke Riviera
in Technicolor

99

a

TU E S D A Y  O N L Y  
October lEth 

BARG AIN  D AY

No Questions
Asked”

with
BERRY SU LLIVAN  

and GEORGE M URPHY

W E D N E SD A Y  - T H U R S D A Y  
October 17-18th

i t

K IR K  DOUGLAS

The Big 
Carnival”

F R ID A Y  O N L Y  
October 19th

Matinee lad  Evening

“The Red Shoes?
------------ toj

1



R A T E S
CLASSIFIED INFORMATION 

M M ttam  Chug* ................  15c
Par word, fin t insertion .......3c
Following insertions to
A ll ads CASH with order, unless 
easterner has an established ac­
count with The Leader.

F O R  S A L E
FOUR FOOT ROTARY SCRAP­

ERS at $95.00. K-.tlai k Machin­
ery Co. Phone 282. (ltfc )

hundred.
Rye Seed—$2 85 per bu. 

Clarendon Produce
(33tfc)

FOR SALE — Two 100 capacity 
finishing batteries; two electric 
automatic brooders, 50 and 125 
capacity. Also light 2-wheel 
trailer. S. B. Chenault, Lelia 
Lake. (36-p)

EXPERT TRUSS FITTING— 
Stocking's Drug Store

Since 1885

RED A N T  BALLS—Extenninate 
red ant beds with Durham’s 
R iil Ant Balls. Uct Red Ant 
Balls at

Stocking's Drug Stors

Limited amount o f Dressed Beef 
for your locker, half or whole 
carcass. Donley County Con­
sumer Frozen Food Locker.

(27tfc)

FOR SALE— Twin bed, complete 
with springs and mattress, like 
new; also dresser. Call 488-R

(35-p)

FOR SALE — A  good Filling 
Station on Highway. Selling 
due to health. Phone 231 or 
write Box 721. , (36-p)

FOR SALE — One new 51 Ford 
Fordamatic Fordor. First come, 
first served. See Pat Slavin.

(22tfc)

M ITES & BLUE BUGS—Aven- 
arius Carbolineum will kill and 
repel] chicken pests for many 

months. Sold at—
Stocking's Drug Stors

A L F A L F A  - SWEET CLOVER — 
Use Culture “A ”  Nitragin the 
original Legume inoculator. 
Get it at

Stocking's Drug Stors

A lfalfa Seed— $36 per hundred 
Hairy Vetch— $20 per hundred 
Austrian Winter Peas—$7.50 per

PRESCRIBED BY
F A S H I O N
tor

U q Loveliness

FOR SALE — ‘44 Massie Harris 
Tractor with lister, cultivator, 
planter, 4 row knife attach­
ment, and 4 row rotary hoe. 
Has Flash-O-Trac System, also 
10 inch Feed Mill and belt. See 
Ed Mahaffey, Ashtola. (35-p)

FOR SALE— Ford tractor, lister, 
cultivator, one-way, go-devil. 
2 miles west of town. B. E. 
Jones. (37-p)

FOR SALE— Nice 6 room home, 
double garage, concrete cellar, 
orchard, out buildings, 4 acres. 
R. P. Harmon, Phone 480-R.

(24tfc)

. THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

Mr. and Mrs. Frank White, Jr. 
and. Frank III spent the weekend
with Mr. and Me*- Joe K im ­
brough at Sherman, Texas. A ll 
were in Dallas Saturday for the 
opening day of the Fair.

Thursday. October 11, 1M1

HORN FLYS—Repell Horn Flys 
from range cattle for a long 
period by using 50% Wettable 
D D T  Powder. Large quanti­
ties at

Stocking's Drug Store

NEW POTTERY — Another new 
shipment of Bauer Pottery lust 
received. See the many new 
pieces.

Stocking's Drug Store

Limited amount of Dressed Beef 
for your locker, half or whole 
sumer Frozen Food Locker, 
carcass. Donley County Con- 

(27tfc)

DAISY F LY  KILLERS — Old 
fashioned Daisy Fly Killers are 
the best for houseflys. Get 
Daisy Fly Killers at 

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE— Modern three room 
house. Close in, also 6 ft. Servel 
Refrigerator. M. L. Pittman. 
Phone 417-J. (37-p)

FOR SALE — Trailer Chassis, 
tires and wheels. Price $30. 
Frank Peden, Goodnight, Texas

(37-p)

SHOP AR M Y-N AV Y STORE — 
Officer Bed Rolls, New $7.50. 
Fufl line of children’s and 
Junior Hand Made Boots.

(35-p)

FOR SALE— 12 x 24 ft. building. 
A. E. Baxter. Phone 349. (35tfc)

MUSIC! MUSIC! MUSICI Many 
new selections, all the popular 
hits with piano arrangement. 
Many new folios, western and 
Mountain ballads.

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE—Good clean 49 Ford 
four door sedan, new tires and 
new battery. Motor in top con­
dition. Reasonable. Maurice 
Lane. Phone 74. (33tfc)

W A N T E D

CONVALESCENT HOME I 
Best of care given invalids and 
elderly people in our home. 
Phone 187. Mrs. J. C. Black­
burn. (37-p)

WANTED—Salesman to demon 
strate and sell Stanley Home 
Products. Lady or Gentleman. 
Unit Manager Neda Richard­
son, Paducah, Texas, Box 174 
or Phone 133R. (36-p)

F O R  R E N T

FOR RENT—Apartment upstairs. 
520 East 3rd St. Mrs. A. T. Cole. 
Phone 154. (31tfc)

FOR R E N T-O n e bedroom with 
private bath. Call 461 or 143.

(29tfc)

FOR RENT —  2 room furnished 
apartment with kitchen privi­
leges. Phone 363-M. (30tfc)

See Victory Courts for furnished 
apartments. Would consider 
care of Courts if same would 
be considered. C. W. Winches­
ter, owner. (35-p)

rn the New'
FLYING COLORS
Stocking's D.*ug Store

■lac* 1685

FREE FEED  
Until Jan. 1, 1652

40 pounds o f Gooch’s Best Laying 
Mash or Pellets will be given 
free with every 160 pounds 
purchased.

Clarendon Produce

FOR SALE— New lumber in as­
sorted sizes. Also do saw 
sharpening, roofing and repair 
work. T. J. Talley, north of 
Depot. (37-o>

FOR RENT —  2 room furnished 
apartment. See Mrs. Ida Couch, 
Phone 338-R. (34tfc)

F O R  RENT — Small furnished 
house. See Mrs. C. E. Griggs. 
Phone 338-J. (34tfc)

FOR RENT —  Furnished apart­
ment. Private entrance. Ray- 
bum Smith. (36-p)

M IS C E L L A N E O U S
Positively No Hunting on my 

place or along the road adjoin­
ing my place. Lee Shaller.

(46-p)

W ARREN - CHENAULT 
Incoma Tax Service 

J. A . Warren E. X  Chenault
Clarendon, Texan 

Offices: 209 Goldston Building

STOCKING’S DRUG STORE
Sine* 1885

H O U S 6  P M H T

I K  Horn* Paine ghtt 
| gta e Paine * tenet.. .  I 

gmtof baaatg) 
»OM»y of this point i and gnttetlon at at 
ffca onvy of your V extra tort. J

Alcoholics Anonymous meet 
ev«ry Monday night 8 p. m 
Donley Hotel basement. A ll In­
terested are Invited. (2tfc)

Write for information about the 
Lone Star Builders Supply Inc. 
Preferred Stock drawing 5% 
interest and participating with 
the Common Stock up to 10%. 
P. O. Box 923, Wellington, 
Texas. (34-4c)

DK. H. R. BECK
D E N T I S T
Goldston Bldg.

Clarendon, Texas Phona 46

Joe Goldston
OPTOMETRIST 
Goldston Bldg, 

CLARENDON, TEXAS 

88

''Asthma
Hay Fever . . .

If will ba dm wfcltMt wMta 
> an ymr ifront and It wfll stay whito

It Hft to gtt H* 9K
O nly  S5.95 par gallon

■"'.■ON SARC-fNJ _ [l I R fst  P a ' nt S o i d

THOMPSON BROS.
H ardw ara It Farm  Equipment

.  **«y h w  you
*—r It to younvlf

•  " • • H  U Iny attnnln

A s t h m a V E M T
tf yw ars e n r  W *|-*iinffiflit. *1 
H*— h row mfcufaf tor h— i

Thornberry Drug
Phona 93

Mrs. Lloyd McCord is a patient 
in the Goodall Hospital at Mem­
phis having been taken there 
Sunday.

Rev. and Mrs. John S. Ellis, 
Bill and Johnny of Dallas are 
visiting relatives here.

Pau l' Dean Hanna of Isiwton, 
Okla. arrived Thursday to visit 
in the home of his aunt, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. H. Howze and Jimmy 
Dean.

Mrs. A. J. Hicks, Pamela and 
Billy Mac were Amarillo visitors 
Saturday. Billy Mac remained for 
the night returning home Sunday 
evening.

Mrs. R. H. Beville and Mrs. 

Flora White of Amarillo visited 
friends and relatives in Claren­
don Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Hutson of 
Borger spent the weekend with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. I. 
Spurgeon.

Don Boyles of Oklahoma City 
visited Tuesday evening in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. T. G. Wiley 
and boys.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Nichols, 
Martha and RaNell of Dallas 
spent the weekend with relatives 
here.

Mr. and Mrs. G. W. Estlack and 
Jackie left Thursday for Dallas 
where they attended the Sigma
Delta (" hi dinner Friday evening 
and attended the State Fair 
opening Saturday. They returned 
home Sunday afternoon.

Miss Anna Moores and Mrs. 
Simmons Powell w ill spend the 
week end in Dallas where they 
will attend the State Fair Musical 
“Guys & Dolls” .

Donley County Leader, $2.50 year

MISSION PEAS
_____ PIGGLY

WIGGLY

303 size Can .14

Crackers — .55
MEALK IM B E L L S  

Long am it Lasts 10 lb sack .76
Vienna Sausage

70 CAN S

$ ^0 0

HOMINY
Diamond Brand— 303 sis# Can

TURNIP GREENS
Diamond, No. 2 Cana— 2 (or 25c
FRUIT COCKTAIL
Del Monto— No. 2 Vi Can 42c
Briinfull— 28 oz. Jar 24c

G R A P E S
Pound .. 15c

^ \ 2 j g g |  LETTUCE 1 5 c, .  __________________________________________________
M jm  CABBAGE g r

' ^ u n d  .............................

'  *  A C L

SPUDS
White— 10 lbs.

C an_ _
OUR V A LU E

S A L M O N

41c

BRAZIL NUTS
Pound . . . . . . .

49c
LEMONS
Doson ............... 36c

E A R L Y  L A N E , Owner Phono 98-J Wo Deliver
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♦  f
♦ Gabie Betts burton *

Library Notes *
t  By May L. Prewitt ♦♦  ♦  
♦  ♦ ♦ ♦  +  * *  + + « ' ♦ *  + * «

The New York Herald Tribune 
carries a review of “The Presi­
dent’s Lady” by Irving Stone. It 
is reviewed by Mary Ross, and 
although it is very appealing, we 
have “Home To The Hermitage” 
by Leland Crabb. It is quite well 
written, and we can’t afford this 
other copy just now.

John P. Marquad has a new 
novel "M elville Goodwin, U.S.A.” 
He has a character in this novel 
who is a secondary to the title 
holder, but has been familiar in 
some of his other books. James 
Hilton reviews “Melville Good­
win, U.S.A.” in the Herald Tri­
bune. We will not likely purchase 
this for awhile. James Hilton's 
“Morning Jaurney” is abridged in 
a recent Omni book which we 
possess.

‘The Country Gentleman” has

a pleasing aiticle by F. F. Rock­
well— “Bulbs That Bring An 
Early Spring.” The suggestions 
could be used very effectively, 
and the bulbs are for sale in most 
catalogues.

For the romance readers we 
offer “The Story of Andrea 
Fields, Woman & Doctor” by 
Elizabeth Seifert, and for those 
who enjoy an “ inner sanctum 
mystery” we possess the “Edge of 
Panic” by Henry Kane. We can 
use your Library fee, so come 
read with us.

Faye Heame of Ft. Worth visit­
ed last week with her sister, Mrs. 
Clyde Butler. They visited 
friends and relatives in Claude, 
Amarillo, and Borger thru the 
week.

CAKE SALE
Mrs. Blevins’ Third Grade will 

sponsor a Cake Sale at the Clar­
endon Electric beginning at 10 
A. M. Saturday morning. You are 
invited to come by and select a
r-a|re fo r  the w eok  end

PROM S won<̂ê  promise to you-
m*  easier, lovelier home permanent 

needs N O  neutralizer/
Here’s the new easy method. 30 minutes after 
applying Prom lotion, rinse with water — your 
wave neutralizes itself automatically as it dries. 

Prom takes every time. Even if other perma­
nents have failed. Prom keeps its promise. It’s 
guaranteed to give you a soft, natural-looking 
wave that lasts 4 months or more. Prom leaves 
your hair in better condition — soft, shining, 
easy to set. Promise yourself a PROM today I

Rebekah Lodge In 
Weekly Meeting

The Clarendon Rebekah Lodge 
held their weekly meeting Oct. 
2nd with 28 members present.

There is an attendance contest 
on and all members are urged 
to attend each meeting.

A fter Lodge adjourned, hus­
bands and guests were enterta’ .i- 
ed by a “height measuring” 
game. Those in attendance p^'d 
one cent per inch of height.

Delicious pie ‘a la mode' and 
coffee were served to: Messrs, 
and Mesdames Mac Spurgeon, 
Truett Behrens, Steve Donald, 
Curtis Mears, Bert DeBord, Bob 
Hill, Spivey, Shorty Flowers, W. 
McBrayer, Seth Edens, F. A. Fitz­
gerald, Mrs. Abbye Warner 
Helen Jo Land, Helen Martin, 
Jessie Faye Thompson, Lucille 
Swinney, Doris Maxey, Jo Veta 
Heatherly, Mrs. W. H. Moore, 
W illie Kay Wade, Frances Mc­
Cord, Bei.mt Crabtree, Rowina 
Parker, Jo Briggs, Chloe Smith, 
Ola Bradshaw, Billie Beard and 
Keith Bain.

Hostesses for the evening were 
Ophelia Edens, Florene Hill and 
Gladys Eddings.

An enjoyable evening was re­
ported by everyone.

Trtr, DONLEY COUNTY LEADER .

MONTGOMERYS 
ENJOY VISITING

Mr. and Mrs. W. M. Montgom­
ery, pioneer residents of Claren­
don, enjoyed one of “the happiest 
days of their lives” Sunday when 
their children, grandchildren and 
two nieces gathered at their 
home in Clarendon. To Mr. Mont­
gomery’s surprise, he found the 
children and grandchildren had 
come to help celebrate his 79th 
birthday. The nieces did not 
know of the birthday but their 
presence added to the enjoyment 
of the day. A  lovely dinner awas 
prepared and served at the noon 
hour by the children.

Mr. and Mrs. S. F. Kelling of 
Ft. Worth and Mr. and Mrs. A. C. 
Chenault of Weatherford, the 
ladies being nieces of Mrs. Mont­
gomery, were here' for their first 
visit in several years. Others 
present included the four child­
ren and their families, Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Montgomery and fam­
ily of Memphis, Mr. and-Mrs. Bill 
Montgomery and children of 
Leslie, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Mont­
gomery and family of Leslie, Mrs.

P hGE kEVO i

Mr. and Mrs. Buster Campbell 
and family have moved to Claude 
to make their home. They visited 
last week in the*7iome of Mrs. 
E W. Tyler while moving from 
Fairplay, Colo.

(ft# onv plQBiit cur/*/*

SOPER

Only Prom oM*r* a special 
lotion for your typo hair

PARKER-PERKINS

Mrs. Lloyd Benpon, Janice and 
B'-rnie were Amarillo visitors 
Saturday.

A. H. MOORE
WATER WELL DRILLER

IRRIGATION
Clarendon. Texas 

Phone 405-W

■for Each M l a Nau/
P H IL C O

of their Very Own!
Yes, there’s a new 19S1 Phllco

that’s just right for every member 
of ths family. Each model a sensation 

in performance, tone and value!

JOHNNY will really 
’ ’go” for this smart 
Ebony PT  530. A 
super- perform ing 
com pact 
beauty at

M OTHia can listen to favorite programs 
while in the kitchen . . .  beer thgv. with 
delightful tone with this gleam­
ing Ivory P T  532 table radio.

MARY will enjoy 
this “ 631”  Personal 
Portable at home 
and away. AC, DC, 
Battery.
6 Colon!

DAO can now heat 
music, news, a porta, etc. 
with new clearness of 
tons,. . .s v e n  on to ­
day's crowded airwaves.J 
Super-powered 
Philco 930 at

Com* In — i n  them, try them! 
Buy singly, in pairs, or all 
together on our sp ecia l
EASY PAYMENT TERMS

★  Now TUBE SAVER
now eliminates tube burn­
outs due to power surges.

Edna Smith and children of 
Amarillo, and Mrs. Vet* Smith 
and Lester of Clarendon.

Visiting and reminiscing was 
the program of the day.

DR. COWAN TO AUSTIN
Dr. Robert L. Cowan, pastor of 

the Presbyterian Church, left 
Monday morning for Austin 
where he will attend the Pres­
byterian Synod, this week. This 
meeting commemorates the One 
Hundredth Anniversary of the 
United States Presbyterian Synod 
in the state of Texas.

Pfc. Dean Wadsworth arrived 
Monday morning to spend an 18 
day furlough with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. D. F. Wadsworth. 
Dean ir stationed at Grenier A ir 
Base, Manchester, New Hamp­
shire.

Mr. and Mrs. Clark and Jim T 
of Pampa visited the week end 
in the home of Mrs. E. W. Tyler. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Lee and 
James Leslie of Claude were also 
guests in the Tyler home Sunday.

Friday, Oct. 12th
Being a Legal Holiday
WE WILL BE CLOSED 

ALL DAY

Donley County State Bank 
Farmers State Bank 
First National Bank

Members Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

ESTLACK MACHINERY COMPANY
YOUR LOCAL PHILCO DEALER 

A L L IS -C H A L M E R S  F A R M  M A C H IN E R Y  —  O LD S M O B ILE  

Phono 262 i- Clarendon. Toxas

SAVE THE CASH W A Y

m

PRICES
€0€AM

atari

Sugar
COFFEE
SOUP

P I N E A P P L E
No. 2 Can . . . . . . . . . . . . 2 7  C

F L O U R
25 lb. Sack. . . . . . . . . . . . . . $198
G O L D  M E D A L  or P U R A S N O W  *

8510 P o u n d s ............................. 9

Q / J
W H IT E  S W A N

Pound .................................... £

C A M P B E L L 'S  W W

V E G E T A B L E  ^  ^

____________2 Tall Cans............. ..................

S H O R T E N I N G  
3 lbs. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6 9 c
A R M O U R S_____________________________________

PORK & BEANS 
3 Tall Cans. . . . . . . . . . .

SALMON Largo Can .39
LETTUCE F IR M  L A R G E  H E A D

Only .10
Bacon SLIC E D

Pound .39
W E  R ESERVE

R IG H T  TO

L IM IT  Q U A N T IT Y

M-SYSTEM
We Deliver Phone 193

P A Y IN G  

T O P  P R IC E  

FO R  E G G S

r, • • “ .  ̂w

/ * Y * * & 1
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WHITE
SWAN

FRIDAY & SATURDAY

Pineapple is r  .85 j Peaches C A L IF O R N IA  

Heavy Syrup 

N r. 2 Vi Cans— 4 for

C R I S C O 31b can
W H ITE  SW A N

46 oz. Cans— 3 for .89
ork&BeansW O RLD  OVER 

300 size— 10 for .99
Corn W H ITE  SW A N  

303 size— 5 Cans

Peas CONCHO 

303 Size— 7 Cans

P A Y

CASH

A N D

P A Y

LESS

I

i&m

PURASNOW

FLOUR
25 lb. Sack

$1.89
Purasnow representative w ill be In 

our store A ll D ay Saturday.

HAMS
SAUSAGE H O M E M A D E  

Pound .............

SPINACH
W hite Swan, 303 size— 4 Cans 69c FR EE HOMINY

W hite Swan. 303 size— 11 Cans .................... 99c
OATS
Pu rity  w ith premium— 3 lb. Box 35c PEACHES

W hite Swan. 303 size— 5 Cans 99c
.. *

PINEAPPLE
W hite Swan, Crushed. Flat Cans— 6 for 99c and watch the number of your basket. You may 

receive your Groceries Free.
Also be sure and register for

PINEAPPLE JUICE
W hite Swan. No. 2 Cans— 5 for\-----

99c
BEANS
Cut Green. Wapco, No. 2 Cans— 6 for 99c FREE-15 lb. CURED HAM KLEENEX

200 Count— 6 Boxes 89c
P A Y

C ASH

A N D

P A Y

LESS

JU N IO R  SPIER. Owner CLAR EN D O N , TE X A S "TRADE A T  HOME W ITH  H O M E FO LK S" C LAR E N D O N . TE X A S W E D E LIV E R

GRAPES
Toltsy '*—'bound 9c WHITE SWAN

COFFEE
WILL BE SERVED FREE 

A l l  D a y  Saturday

POPCORN
W hite Swan— 6 Cans ......................................................... 99c

LEMONS
Sunkist— Dozen 29c * CATSUP

W hite Swan— Bottle ..................................................... 22c
CELERY
N ice Stalk 15c . APPLE BUTTER

'  W hite Swan— 28 os. Jar 25c

Orange Juice P A L M  BEACH 

46 oz. Cans— 4 for .99 Tomatoes .99
White Swan C O F F E E  lb .83

________________ : ___________________________________________________________________________________________ : ________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________

A  O
P IC N IC  &

Pound .................................... 9 A

.39

UVC*! '  * ’ r -----

___ A ..

mm , : 1̂*1 > !■ ‘ i* .

I F

G O O D

Pound i e e e • • < .69



Thunder. October il. 1U1__________

Donley County Lender, $2.90 year The
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Spotlight 
V a lu e s

at YOUR FAVORITE DRUG STORES

50c Phillips Milk of Magnesia. . . . . . . . . . . 39c
$1.20 Syrup of Pepsin. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 79c
25c Bayer Aspirin . . . . . . . . . . . . . . * . 13c
25c Granulated Black Draught. . . . . . . . 11c
60c Campho Phenique. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 39c
59c Pepsodent Economy Tooth Paste. . . . 41c

0

Pint of Rubbing Alcohol. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 29c
45c Fletchers Castoria. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 36c
Two Conveniently Located Stores to Serve 
You.

%

W E  RESER VE  TH E  R IG H T  TO  L IM IT  Q U A N T IT IE S
• •• , - . . .  h

» •

City Drug Store Thornberry Drug
H E D LE Y . T E X A S C L A R E N D O N , T E X A S

S& H  Green Stamps Gunn Bros. Thrift Stamps

Mike Thornberry. O w n «r

Donley County 
Soil Conservation 

District News
T. C. D’Spain was unanimously 

re-elected Supervisor of Subdi­
vision No. 3 last week ct an elec­
tion held in Alanreed. About 
thirty people turned out for the 
election and a soil conservation 
program presented by Flip 
Breedlove, County Agent and 
Carman Rhode, Soil Conserva­
tion Service.

The best part of the entire af­
fair, according to George Pres­
ton, was the delicious home-made 
donuts and coffee served by Mrs. 
T. C. D’Spain at the close of the 
program.

Supervisor D’Spain has been a 
member of the Board since the 
District began operation about 
4 Vi years ago. He will now begin 
serving a new five year term.

A  supervisor is elected in only 
one of the five subdivisions in 
the District each year and in that 
manner each supervisor serves a 
five year term.

A Supervisor's job carries with 
it a lot more responsibility and is 
of much more importance than 
the average person thinks. It re­
quires much time and thought to 
supervise the activities of the 
District program. These men 
serve unselfishly giving of their 
time and setting aside their per­
sonal interests for the good of 
their community. They receive 
the handsome salary of $4.00 per 
month from the State of Texas. 
Every fanner and every business 

j man in Donley County should be 
grateful and should support the 
supervisors in the work they are 
doing.
Woodward Field Day 
Announced

The Fifteenth Annual Range

J A C K  E. G R A Y
PUBL iC BOOKKEEPING 
ACCOUNTING SYSTEMS 
FlN ANC-I^l *VT4T rMFNTS

V E TE R IN A R Y
H O SPITAL
Business Phone 97 

Residence Phone 288-M 

SERUM ■ VACCINES 

8c Supplies Available

cVze rft/p ark/j/ou//ree w/n/

o  Ly c j k..j- ’

Then Any Other
* Longest of the Lot

Chevrolet looks longest, 
Chevrolet is longest . . .  a 
swank and sweeping 197% 
inches over-all that tops any 
other car in the low-price 
field. Size up Chevrolet’s 
greater length, and you’ll find 
jt hard to settle for less.

Most Road-Hugging 
Weight

Gives yob more road-hugging, 
road-smoothing weight . . . ■ 
a hefty 3140 pounds! in the 
model illustrated that no com­
parable car in the field can 
match. Get the feel of this' 
big car, and you won’t settle1 
for less. (tShipping weight.) ’

W idest Tread in Its Held
Here’s the steadiness of the 
widest tread in the field . . . 
58% inches between centers 
of rear wheels. Once you’ve 
known the better roadability 
of Chevrolet's wider tread, 
you wouldn't settle for less.

Finest
Comfort Features

Luxury of Body by Fisher . . .  
cradled ease of unitized Knee 
Action . . . smooth control of 
Center-Point Steering!

Biggest Brakes «f Any 1 
Low-Priced Car

Big, powerful Jumbo-Drum 
brakes—largest in the low-price 
field! Use the car’s own momen­
tum to increase stopping power.

m m
Low-Priced C a rl,

The Styleline De Lux* 4-Door Sedan 
(Continuation of standard equipment and trim Ifhtt-1.  -*---------- «- -  * ___ n n m 'li .t . ; | : i „  _ S  -------I Iso wpvnuwi va jTUiiiioiiiiy os mnwioi./

/Way Ahead with 
Valve-in-Head

The trend's to valve-in-head. And 
Chevrolet's had it for nearly 40 
years! Get sparkling perform­
ance and real over-sU economy.

M s  ike SMII to Mo-ShWt F O O T n t f lt t U
Transmission *

Sensationally smooth! Excitingly easy! It's a new experience 
in driving, the modern way to drive. Costs little more—or 
even less than many a car with standard gearshift!
•Combination o f Powerglide Automatic Transmission and 
Saglns optional on De Luxe models at extra cost.

Clarendon Motor Company
C L A R E N D O N , T E X A S

Improvement Field Day will be 
held n^xt Saturday, October 13, 
by the USDA Great Plains Field 
Station at Woodward, Oklahoma.

This should be a very interest­
ing and worthwhile trip for a 
large number of ranchers and 
stockmen in this area. Everyone 
is invited to attend, according to 
D. A. Savage, Station Superin­
tendent.

Some of the subjects to be dis­
cussed will be: “Ten years of 
grazing and feeding results with 
beef-cattle on native and reseed­
ed pastures” ; "Financial Prob­
lems of the Cattle Industry” ; and 
“Progress in Rain Making.”

The all-day meeting and tour 
of regrassing, grass breeding, 
brush control, and beef cattle 
grazing studies will start at 8:00 
A. M. at the station headquarters 
one mile southwest of Wood­
ward.

Anyone planning to make this 
trip who has room for additional 
passengers or who wants to ride 
with someone else please contact 
Carman Rhode at the Soil Con­
servation Office or call 157.

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP
Management, circulation, etc., re­
quired by the Act of Congress of 
August 24, 1912, as amended by 
the Acts of March 3, 1933 and 
July 2, 1946, of the Donley
County Leader published weekly 
at Clarendon, Texas for October, 
1951.
State of Texas, County of Donley.

Before me, a notary public in 
and for the state and county 
aforesaid personally appeared 
G. W. Estlack, who, having been 
duly sworn according to law, de­
poses and says that he is the 
business manager and co-publish­
er of the Donley County Leader, 
and that the following is, to the 
best of his knowledge and belief, 
•a true statement of the owner­
ship, management of the afore­
said publication for the date 
shown in the above caption, re­
quired by the Act of Congress of 
August 24, 1912, as amended by 
the Acts of March 3, 1933, and 
July 2, 1946.

That the publishers are A. D. 
Estlack and G. W  Estlack, both 
of Clarendon, Texas. That the 
editor is A. D. Estlack, and the 
business manager. . is G. W. 
Estlack, both of whhm reside in 
Clarendon, Texes. That the own­
er is J. C. Estlack, residing in 
Clarendon, Texfs.

That the bondholders and other 
forms of indebtedness are: None.

That the average number o f 
copies of each issue of this pub­
lication sold or distributed, 
through the mails or otherwise, 
to paid subscribers during the 
twelve months preceding the 
date shown is 1752.

G. W. Estlack 
Business Manager.

Sworn to and subscribed before 
me this 29th day of September, 
1951.

Billie Faye Guill 
My commission expires 6-1-1953.

The average human heart 
weighs about 11 ounces.

More than 110,000 persons vis­
ited Palo Duro State Park last
year.

T. M. SHAVER
A R M Y  8t N A V Y  STORE 

212 Sully Street 

Clarendon, Texas 

For W ork Clothes 8t Shoes 

Buy for Less

NOTICE
For the next lew weeks we will 
be In our shop on TUESDAYS— 
THURSDAYS 81 SATURDAYS 

O NLY

EANES
Radio Service
EDWIN EANES. Owner 

Located at Estlack Mach'y Co.

NEVER BUY REAL ESTATE 
WJTHOUT AN ABSTRACT

Donley County Abstract Company
C. E. K ILLOUGH

Phone 44

STOP, LOOK and LISTEN!
I w ill pay above the market price for K a ffir  or 
Milo, testing 13 or lower moisture.

Egg prices are fine, so w hy not feed Chic-O- 
Line, or Wes-Tex Egg Mash, Pellets, or Crumbles? 
The feed that get results; None better at any price.

EM PTY  FEED SACKS W A N T E D
TU R N  YO U R  E M PT Y  SACKS IN T O  CASH . 

When you think of feed, think of us. Feed and 
seed is our only business. A  feed for every  need.

W e g ive Green Stamps; ask for them.
A  car of Colorado best lump Coal just unloaded.

Simpson’s Mill & Feed Store
Phone 149

washer does a n y 
kind o f wash 
autom atically

Only Frigidoite hen Uve-Woler Action I
Live-Water Action provider surging, penetrating current! of 
hot. lucky water that gets clothes redly clean -  gently! Clothe* 
are in water all the time -  not half in, haU out. Uve-Water 
Action also rinses twice, each tim* in clean, (rath water.

See how beautifully this new washar Bts into kitchens-as 
w,° "tifty nwm “ d Uundiia*. Fits dote to the trail... 
new high back-pansi p n  all eoatrob in aasy, safa reach.

Frigidair* s Ranfeky-Spia gats clothe* far dritr than moat 
•thtr washers. Many cloth** an ready to iron at otto* All am 
lighter, metes to lift and carry.

Wn Finish Inahk
Ite with FrtgMairtl 
protects against not, 
at a china petal

O-1-•-- a-OLxciutive wnn
fin tin protects 
MtHy

Oetl
U Ufa 

raat, soap or bleaches
-on-steelporcelain •<

Cleans as quickly.

Exclusive Frigidair# Select-O-OMI
pre-select the proper wishing time on the Salect- 

0*Dial -  set it once and the Frigjdaire Washer dons 
all the rest. It even deans itielf and shuts off 
matically.

Yes Ma'am .
We can deliver your 

now frlgidalrm Washoe 
Immediately .  VII Be 
tlud to toko aver 
your washday 
shores.

R . K .

I

R A X ------•w e s t

I f ■ Jit* iten



show the Bargain Prices on the thousands of items in our store, but E V E R Y  ITEM  IS ON SALE

w »*W -»v iJ  luo I.rf ,nl lUri too — «m i» oHl 11a vilrw n. 
.»«■ « ,m>t j  nb ra Muf ilwi .tcnwl tMnh •*]* n

- mo ot* m Y

tu «X  u v lU b  « »>  «W

'(ebAitw tv«\ * nobilifimgi? lltnmotuA
h-xjM wan c *’il !vw? vUmtiajr.3 iriioorn* v!fr.r>oftt/n5?. X

■) • -/nl» <; . vf i iWib ni a

fSotyiO j » a q e-f<e'H-oit> i
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C A S H  
0  N  L  Y

POSITIVELY NO RETURNS -  NO EXCHANGES -  EVERY SALE FINALThe Money Saving Event O f The Year A Real Xmas Present For The Public
P A IN T  - W A L L P A P E R, t j . . . .

AN OPPORTUNITY TO REFINISH YOUR HOME AT A SAVING YOU MAY NEVER SEE AGAIN.
BEST QUALITY OUTSIDE

W HITE PAINT
PER GALLON

# ONLY $3.98
ENAMELS, VARNISHES, FLATS, STAINS, 
ROOF PAINTS - all at

BARGAIN PRICE

BUY ONE ROLL

W ALLPAPER
#

. AT REGULAR PRICE 

NEXT ROLL FOR

ONLY 1 CENT
Hundreds of Patterns to Select From

GAS AND BUTANE HEATERS-WERE $23.80-S A L E  PRICE. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $11.95

30 GALLON COLEMAN HOT WATER TANK -  WAS $140.00 -  SALE PRICE. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $98.50

ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES -  HARDWARE -  TOOLS -  DON’T MISS THE MANY BARGAINS IN THIS DEPT.
CONGOWALL - - FOR YOUR KITCHEN AND B A T H - O N L Y  44 CENTS per ft.

Dmy Your Xmas Gifts Now
ru n  mm—Mot wins, tunes, Hunting Coats, Trousers -  Rods, Reels, Tackle Boxes, all kinds of Fishing Equipment. 
FORHER-Ss Iverwarej Jewelry, Appliances, Purses, etc.
FOR i l lE  KIDDIES—Toys. Tricycles, Trains, Dolls, Footballs. Many, many other Items.
Folk* • - a m  m  not space to

rM B feigh t • v t tu b a l

n th r»i df<i£ 
'•■odw ic n  'o  
’>1 9tli a won A

inUu!)# uoy

■
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whether the firms are in com­
pliance with government price 
laws.

“Those firms required to make 
postings but who have failed to 
comply are operating in violation 
of the Office of Price Stabiliza­
tion regulations,”  Gehring, em­
phasized.

In reviewing the posting re-

the district OPS office. These 
ceiling prices, too, must be post­
ed visibly at the station. Some of 
the services which most stations 
sell are washing, greasing, re­
pairing flat tires, towing, and

business, price officials said. 
They are required to post their 
ceiling prices of gasoline, and all 
petroleum products as to grade. 
Their selling prices, which may 
be below ceiling prices, need not 
be posted.

tions, garages, farm machinery 
repair and maintenance firms, 
and machine shops and welding 
shops.

Costumer Durable Postings
Firms retailing consumer dur­

ables such as wearing apparel, 
furniture, housewares, notions— 
all those covered by ceiling price 
regulation 7 and amendments.

are, in addition to service sta­
tions, laundries and dry cleaning 
establishments, automobile gar­
ages, gins, welding and machine 
shops, farm machinery repair 
shops, practically all other types 
of repair shops, and many other 
service businesses, except those 
specifically exempt.

If a firm uses flat rates, it was 
pointed out, such rates must be 
posted. However, if they are so 
numerous «as to make posting 
cumbersome, there should be a 
statement in the posting that

and other artifacts are reported Thomas Edison invented guin- 
almost daily by visitors to Palo med paper.
Duro State Park. Finds are re- --------------------------—
corded and placed on exhibit in Donley Countv Lender. 82 50 vewv

ROOST SPREAD
Dr. J. W . Evans

Dentist and Orthodontist 

Phone 285 • Clarendon. Texas
Rom where I sit... 6y Joe Marsh

When passing motorists require facilities for service 
station, the distinctive beauty of Celocrete Block bu ild­
ings attract thoir attention. This 6G service station was 
built for T. A. Arnold. Cary, Texas by B. T. Hockens. 
contractor. Rigers & Trigg Lumber Co. furnished lum ­
ber. windows, doors and hardware.

Celocrete or Vol-Score blocks 8x8x16. 25c; 4x8x16. 
17c, 5C0 or more. Delivered. 1 mile lc  each; 30 mi. 2c; 
50 ml. 3c; 70 ml. 4c. Open 7 to 8:30 A. M. —  1 to 5 P. M.

Blocks 8x8x16. 25c; 4x8x16. 17c, 530 or more. 

Delivered, 1 mile, lc oach; 30 mi. 2c; 50 mi. 3c; 70 mL 4c

Athlete* Foot Germ
After one application of T-4-L 

if not pleased your 40c back. This 
mobile liquid PENETRATES fas­
ter, quicker, deeper to make the 
kill. T-4-L at any drug stole. To­
day at

Stocking's Drug Store 
Wilson's Drug in Hedley

Lice and Mites sre two of your 
chickens worst enemies. They keep

Sour birds awake at night and con- 
nually trouble .hem aurtng the 

day.
Here ii an easy, labor-saving and 

economical method of destroying 
these strength sapping and rrofit- 
taking parasites.

Use Russell's HHC. Roost Spread.
It la a new improved product that 

•aslly gaalfies from the heat of the 
blrd’s body when roosting and 
works up through the feathers reach­
ing all the body lice and feather 
mites. Just a narrow V« inch strip 
painted on the top of each roost 
pole with an oil can or orusn docs 
the Job.

Russell's BHC. Roost Spread
comes in 4 sizes. 8 ozs., 75c: 16 ozs., 
81.89: 32 ozs.. $2.25; gallons, $7.20.

Thornberry Drug
Phone 93

Sizes 6 to 18 feet

Estlack Mach’y Co
BuildersPhone 262 

Clarendon, Texas
Copyright, 795/, United Slates Brewers Foundalion

P. O. Box 923 "  Phone 101-M
1208 - 8th St. WELLINGTON, TEXAS Night 426 - J

wheel you 

ever turned!

wheel you ever held!

it yourself

Chrysler this year introduce* the first 
power steering ever offered on an 
American passenger car. Many owner* 
tell ua it is the greatest advance in 
car driving since the self-starter I To  
a  person who hasn’t triad. 4^- it U  
actually impossible to describe what 
a difference it makes Driving be-

Yea, it's the giant luxury size 
2.1 cu. ft. freezer, until now 
only in refrigerators selling at 
far above $100 more. Enjoy it 
now at this sensational savingkmtuntly provide* 

energy needed to  
> is all sense of tug, 

strain, tendon. In its place you find 
a  wonderful sense of absolute frpnt 
wheel control with almost no effort 
on your part. Hydraguide is regular 
equipment on Crown Imperials, op­
tions r*t  extra cost on orthei 6-cylinder 
models Whatever car you’re driving 
now, we invite you to . . .  „ ; X :

hydraulic
iour-filtha

10.7 cu. ft. In the space ef sld 
»tyls 6 ft. moduli 
True Zero Zens Freezer 
Quick Qhlller and Meal Stereo* 
Ikdeslve Fully A«f{uttoMe 
Shelves
Olest-covettd Twin Crtigere 
Five Veer Warranty

Coma TRY Chrysler Hydraguide 
FbTpewer st-WInt e*w eMtfed e 
Aewriien pswrasw m b  rt ::

Coma TRY Chryaler FkePowar ,

PH I ICO 1114
Jtfssdfct.'OOOjM

MEW S A im n  Evsn off ths 
load onto a soft shoulder, Hy­
draguide help* keep your car 
steady and true with almost 
no effort . . . takes the jolt and 
strain out of driving in ruts, 
m ew > fc e u tx L .  . . makes stear­
in  "P"7 t*ews safer then

MEW CONTROL! Hydraguide
gives your hands on the wheel 
a new feeling of complete com­
mand at any spaed. In city 
traffic . . .  on awkward drive­
ways . . .  in snug-fltting garage

NO MONEY DOWN
your old refrigerator is tho 

down payment.

or twirling, tugging end ztrsln- 
Mt, The 1 idlest led/yed Imow 
can actually peri? the i<cest 
Chrysler with her thumb end 
one linger on the wheel . . . 
drive ail day with new free­
dom from r nB-awd-shoulder

YOUk LOCAL FH1LCO DIALER 
A L L IS -C H A L M E R S  F A R M  M A C H IN E R Y  —

Phono 262

F o r  G o o d  In s u ra n c e

KELLY
CHAMBERLAIN
A ll  T y p e s — A ll  K in d s

P R O M P T  A D J U S T M E N T S

(  I ftren d o n , i t  x a *

P h on e

$00 t o
- ' ' - cj

-w* IN THIS 1 0 .7  CU. FT.§1 P H IL C O

>JP m  y g

W U JCS TV PAV /

M t n f
j II

n

1 YesS’j i

* * I —.

f i »  r  J tTi7Hn""u 

1 \

New* From The 
Office of Price 

Stabilization
Many types of businesses are 

required by ceiling price regula­
tions to have certain postings 
prominently displayed in their 
buildings. Ted Gehring, Lubbock 
district OPS price executive, 
pointed out yesterday, so that 
their customers may know

quirements, district price officials 
pointed out that among the firms 
who must post ceiling prices or 
other statements include depart­
ment stores, clothing stores, va­
riety stores and furniture stores 
covered by ceiTr.g price regula­
tions governing the sale of con­
sumer goods; laundries, dry 
cleaning establishments, cotton 
gins, all kinds repair shops 
and other firms who retail con­
sumer services; and service sta-

are requ ed to have a sign post­
ed in their place of business stat­
ing the following;

"The prices of merchandise in 
this store are no higher than the 
OPS ceiling prices of the arti­
cles." The sign is to be placed so 
as to be plainly visible to the 
store’s customers.

Gasoline Stations Postings 
Gasoline service stations prob­

ably are required to make more 
postings than any other type of

The price of the gasoline as 
shown on the pumps does not 
constitute a posting as required 
by the regulation and may or 
may not be the same us the ceil­
ing price. These postings of ceil­
ing prices of gasoline and pe­
troleum products are not to be 
filed with any OPS office.

However, price officials em­
phasized that service stations are 
required to file a list of their 
ceiling prices on services with

road calls.
, Gasoline stations must post 

their ceiling prices for anti-freezo 
as to type and brand, if they sell 
it. These ceilings must be posted 
on the shelf, bin or rack where 
the anti-freeze is displayed.

Service Establishments 
Those firms retailing services 

are required to post their ceiling 
prices in a place visible to cus­
tomers. Each service should be 
listed. Among the firms covered

there are some flat rates which 
may be found listed in an ade­
quately described price book 
located on the premises and a- 
vnilablc for all to examine.

Firms may withhold from pub­
lic inspection such part of their I 
statements insofar as they apply! 
to non-retail services which they i 
sell.

Finds of phytosaur and other 
reptile teeth, arrowheads, pottery

El Coronado Lodge.
Palo Duro Canyon is 120 mile* 

long and 22 miles wide at itx 
widest point. It begins as gentle 
upland creek bed, becomes a wild 
and deep gorge and gradually 
spreads out into the lower cap- 
rock counties.

The first motion picture the­
ater was opened in Los Angek-s*
Calif.
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New member to the Ain’t 
Smoking Right Now Society is

about the same time that I have 
and is having the same trouble 
with his last years clothes. Any­
way, he says he feels like a new 
man, and what is more important 
than that? More power and Best 
Wishes Jimmie.

People who think they never 
make any mistakes should never 
make the mistake of losing their 
patience with folks who do make
mistakes.

Rep. Gray has introduced a 
James Caperton of Shamrock,, bill in the Texas Legislature forc- 
Texas. He has been off the weed I ing the liquor industry to put

IN SURAN CE OF A LL  K IN D S—

ABSTRACTS OF T IT LE

R E A L  E STATE  t-t N O T A R Y  PU B LIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO.
C. C. POW ELL

Phone 11 Clarendon | $

W e know how you feel, folks. When you bring 

us a prescription that your Doctor has ordered for 

your Baby's Health - - - it's a mighty precious pre­

scription to you. But it's precious to us, too, for w-e 

know that it can moan the difference between a 

lingering illness or a speedy recovery. That's why 

you can depend on us to compound the prescrip­

tions for your precious ones - - - because we al­

ways give THE BEST WE H AVE  - - - of ingred- 

ients, service.

BOB MOSS PHARMACY
THE R E X A LLS T O R E

Phone 35
WE F ILL  A N Y  DOCTOR'S PRESCRIPTION

warnings similar to the following 
on each container: “ Do not over­
indulge— alcohol is habit form­
ing,” and “Do not drink and 
drive, the life you take may be 
your own.” The same would be 
required in all advertising. This 
sounds like a logical and legal 
step in the right direction. This 
should stop the lies that are told 
or implied in the so called “Beer 
Belongs" ads in many of the 
leading magazines. The liquor in­
dustry has followed a policy long 
advocated by the Soviets; make 
a false statement, keep on mak­
ing it until a large number of 
people begin believing it.

Read this some place: ‘The 
time to be happy is now, and the 
place is here.”

We are fast becoming a nation 
that has traded morality for 
legality in many ways. So much 
of the time we do not ask our- 

I selves whether a thing is right or 
not, but rather is it legal. In 
other words can I get by with it 
in the sweet now and now. We 
have long ago forgotten about 
“The Sweet By and By.”  We read 
of the cop who sells his tip-offs 
for fifty dollars a throw, and we 
read of the presidents appointees 
who sell their influence for a few 
grand. We just shake our head 
and keep on in our mad scramble 
to take care of our self. To keep 
our own head far enough above 
the water that if there are any 
drownings we want to be sure it 
won’t be us. We need to: Wait A 
Minute, Watch Till Election Year, 
and Wake Up For A ll Time To 
Come.

Symptoms of Distress Arising from

STOMACH ULCERS 
d u e  t o  EXCESS ACID 
QUICK RELIEF OR NO COST

Ask About 15-Day Trial Offe
Over four million bottles o f the W illard 
T h e  a tm  e n t  h av e  l*H»n sold for relie f o f  
symptoms of distress arising from S to m a ch  , 
and D u od enal U lcere  due to I t e m  A c id — j 
Poor D ig estio n , S o u r or U p ss t  S to m a ch ,  
G a s t ln e ts , H e a rtb u rn , S lee p le ssn e ss , e tc ., ! 
due to Exce ss A d d . Ask for “ W illa rd 's  
M essage" which fully exp la in s this remark­
able home treatment— free— at

BOB MOSS PH ARM ACY

' NOTICE
We are now open from 8 a. m. to 
6 p. m. Week Day*.

8 a. m. to 8 p. m. Saturdays. 
Make this your headquarters for 
all Radio Repairs.

A ll work guaranteed.

CLARENDON RADIO  
SERVICE

Located next door to Ice House,

Blindfold Test Proves Amazing 
Smoothness of Dodge O n flo w  Ride . . .  Lot Us Show You Todayl

BLINDFOLD 
TEST REALLY 
AMAZED ME

bumpy roads felt smooth as highways!"
Soys MAS. MARGUERITE OUNN—
"The Dodge Onflow Ride is really 
velvet-smooth! I took the Blindfold 
Test, and only after the blindfold 
was removed could I believe I'd been 
over such a rough, bumpy road."

. let the Dodge Blindfold Test prove 
Dodge OriSow Ride cakes the bump 
Blindfolded, you travel a stretch of 

Yet with the new Dodge Ori- 
without pitch or bounce, 

are there until your

extra-value features 
visibility 

give you full bend.

leg and shoulder room— so you can ride in com­
fort. Fluid Drive smooths all your suits and stops. 
Yea, you could pay hundreds of dollars more and 
not get all Dodge gives you. Come in today.

The Big Dependable

DODGE
Drive It 9 Miner., and You'll Drive It for Yoon

BARTLETT MOTOR COM PANY; Clarendon; Texas

Brother Ellis points out this 
thought provoking stickler in 
answer to my statement that we 
were just passing on our debts to 
our grandchildren and that our 
economy will blow up some day 
if we don’t slow down. Anyway, 
he points out that when we col­
lapsed in the early thirties and 
the small banks closed and most 
of us were foreclosed upon that 
the money was all owed to the 
Wall Street bankers, mostly any­
way. When they called it in, we 
the people went out. Now the 
people of this government owe 
hundreds of dollars apiece; this 
money is represented by govern­
ment bonds and he asks this 
question: “Who owns most of 
these bonds?” Would the answer 
be the same Wall Street Bank­
ers? If so, don’t We The People 
owe the same folks that we were 
in debt to then? This sounds like 
a good question and won’t some 
good economist please answer it 
for us. The only difference is that 
we are on each others note or 
bond.

In driving into Amarillo from 
the east we are almost made to 
wonder if we are entering the 
town that beer and honky-tonks 
made famous. I don’t remember 
entering another town anywhere 
with as many such joints so con­
spicuous alony. the highways. I 
never pass one oi them but that I 
remember two so-called substan­
tial citizens who a few years ago 
placed their names to page ads in 
the papers asking folks to vote 
wet for the sake ol good govern­
ment and a few measly taxes. 
Each time I read of a drunken 
driver in a car wreck I remember 
these ads. I don’t think anything 
ever hit me over the head like 
those ads. Maybe I am a bit old- 
fashioned about right and wrong, 
but I can’t help it.

White Tail and Mule Deer, 
»

Turkeys, panther, lynx, bobcat, 
porcupine, ringtail cat, civet cat, 
coon, swift, and prairie dogs are 
wild game species found in Palo 
Duro Canyoa

I

LIMITED AMOUNT OF

B E E F
FOR YOUR LOCKER

W e can furnish a lim ited amount of Dressed Beef 
(H alf or whole carcass) for your locker.

Save money by having your own meat - - - when 
you want it.

W e process all kinds of food—Vegetables, Fruits, 
Poultry and other meats. Rent a locker and save 
on your food bills.

W e offer a Complete Processing 

and Storage Service

Donley County Consumer 
Frozen Food Locker

Phone 193 Clarendon, Texas

Mike McCully Named 
U.S.O. Chairman For 
Donley County

Mike M. McCully, of Claren­
don, today was named Donley 
County Chairman for the forth­
coming fund appeal in Texas for 
the U.S.O.

Appointment c f Mr. McCully 
to head the Donley County ap­
peal was announced by Ben H. 
Wooten of Dallas, Campaign 
Chairman of the Texas United 
Defense Fund Committee and 
R. G. Hughes, District 4 Chair­
man of the U.S.O. fund campaign.

In accepting the appointment j 
as County Chairman, Mr. Mc­
Cully pointed out that Donley 
County has a total of 139 boys 
and girls serving in the armed 
forces, and that more young peo­
ple will be called up from time

to time as our defense program 
expands.

“One of our most important 
civic, patriotic and personal re­
sponsibilities is to these young 
people in uniform,” Mr. McCully 
said. “Through the U.S.O. we 
have a means by which we can 
assist in keeping up the morale 
of these young men and women 
who are giving up so much to 
protect our freedom.”

"Let's make certain that the 
fund appeal for $480 in Donley 
County is a success.”

Geo. B. Bagby will leave Satur­
day for Dallas to attend the State 
Fair of Texas and to see the Ice 
Cycles of 1952 and the stage pro­
duction of Guys and Dolls.

About 1000 A. D., the Chinese 
made their coins in the shape of 
the things they wanted to buy.

BO RRO W n

H / U C D r  LOANS IN  A LL  S IZES FOR A L L  
VYnill\ l!« PURPOSES M A Y  BE O BTAIN ED

No matter how much cash you need—$10 or 
$10,000— and no matter for what purpose you need 
it— meeting emergency, paying bills, or purchas­
ing— it ’ll pay you to have a private and confi­
dential talk with one of our friendly officers. Our 
interest rates are low, our terms o f repayment 
easy.

COMPLETE BANKING  SERVICES FOR

PERSONS IN  EVERY W ALK  OF LIFE

Donley County 
State Bank

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Cotper&Ooa

•••and for Industry too!
Hot water... hot water in abundance for the home or the largest 
laundry. And the fuel which heats that water in the Oulf South 
is dependable, low-cost natural gas. It’s the perfect fuel for every 
purpose -*■ the fuel that it helping to make our part of the country 
the brightest industrial location in the nation.

•

United’s position as the world’s largest handler of natural gas is 
made possible by our purchases of gas in more than 200 fields. 
These diversified sources of supply are positive assurance of 
dependable service in omry community which now buys gas 
from our system, or whfAMnay be added to our lines in the future.

UNITED GAS...
S E R V I N G  THE


