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Canadian blows past Bronchos 28-6
The Clarendon Broncos opened 

their 1984 football season with a 
loss to a strong 3A team at 
Canadian. A strong south wind 
played a big part in the game.

The Broncos had the strong wind 
to their back:, the first quarter and 
scored the first time they had the 
ball. Canadian received and after 
they were unable to move the ball, 
punted for 4 yards. The Broncos 
quickly went to work. Rodney 
Smith went 12 around the right end 
and then on 3rd and 9, Trent Sharp 
hit Dean Cearly for 10 yards and a 
first down on the 25 o f Canadian. 
The Bronco score came when Sharp 
found Robert Youngblood in the 
end zone for a 22 yard touchdown 
pass. The PAT attempt was 
blocked. The Broncos had another 
chance to score before the quarter 
changed but a pass from Sharp to 
Youngblood fell incomplete in the 
end zone.

Now facing the wind in the 2nd 
quarter, the Broncos found them­
selves playing defense and they 
played good defense. The first half 
ended in favor o f the Broncos 6-0.

Canadian chose to take the wind 
in the 3rd quarter. They got the 
Broncos in a hole that they never 
got out of. By the end of the third 
quarter the Broncos trailed 20-6. 
They also lost quarterback Trent 
Sharp with a dislocated left elbow. 
He will miss most of the rest of the 
season. Junior Leland Howell 
guided the Broncos the rest o f the 
way.

Canadian added another score 
the final quarter to make the final

score 28-6.
Dewey Mincey lead the defense 

with several tackles.
Booney Gardner and Rodney 

Smith lead the rushing attack with 
Booney gaining 79 yards on 23

carries and Rodney had 73 yards on 
20 carries.

Canadian had 12 first downs 
Clarendon’s 9.

The Broncos home opener 
Friday against Floy dads.

to

Bronchos to host Floydada
The Floydada Whirlwinds came 

to town Friday night to play the 
Broncos at 8:00.

Floydada is coming o ff a 28-0 loss 
to very strong Crosbyton. The

Winds have 6 starters back, both on 
offense and defense.

The Broncos are looking for their 
first win after the opening loss to 
Canadian.

Donley receives $ 1 6 ,0 7 7  
in criminal justice grants
Governor Mark White today an­

nounced the award o f more than *24 
million in criminal justice grants to 
help fight crime in Texas.

Most of these funds will be 
distributed to local law  enforcement 
departments to help initiate 
programs to put more officers on 
the street, operate projects to 
discourage juvenile crime, and or­
ganize citizens into neighborhood 
watch and other crime prevention 
efforts.

"T o  establish safer communities.

we must encourage citizens and the 
police to work together to swiftly 
apprehend criminal offenders and 
to support programs designed to 
discourage young people from en­

gaging in criminal activity,”  
Governor White said.

Funding of these programs is 
made possible through assessing 
fines paid by persons convicted of 
violating criminal laws in Texas.

Donley County District Attorneys 
screening unit 3 received *16,077

Mrs. Gooch to lead St. 
Jude's fall Bike-A-Thon

Notice
Homecoming this year will be 

September 21 when the Broncos 
play Fritch. The senior class will be 
selling homecoming mums this 
year. If you would like to buy your 
lady a mum, please contact the 
Clarendon High School office or see 
any member of the senior class.

Sept. 22
Lelia Lake Community Chicken 

Barbeque will be Saturday, Sep­
tember 22 at 7:00 p.m. Please bring 
VS chicken for each person attend­
ing to the community center by 2 
p.m.

i film to be shewn Tuesday
The game film o f the Clarendon- 

Floydada game will be shown in the 
school cafeteria at 8:00 p.m., Tues­
day, September 18.

Compiled by lom ie Saye - 
Cooperative Observer For National
Weather Service. Garendon.
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St. Jude Children's Research 
Hospital is proud to announce that 
Mrs. Bonnie Gooch has been named 
to lead the 1984 Fall Bike-A-Thon in 
Clarendon.

Gifford Damstrom. St. Jude 
Director of the Southwest Region, 
stated that we are extremely proud 
to find such a dedicated person for 
this very important job.

“ St. Jude Children's Research 
Hospital is the largest and one of 
the leading childhood cancer re­
search centers in the worls and it is 
the first research center dedicated 
exclusively to the research and 
conquest of catstrophic diseases of 
children, such as cancer and other 
life-destroying diseases," Dam­
strom stated. "W hen St. Jude 
accepted its first patient in 1962, 
the survival rate for children diag­
nosed with acute lymphocytic 
leukemia was less than 5%. Today, 
the disease free survival figure for 
children has grown to over 50%. 
Cancer treatment procedures that 
originated at St. Jude are now being 
used to treat children throughout 
the United States and in other parts 
of the world. Such progress has 
brought a world-wide acclaim to St. 
Jude."

"Children come to St. Jude for 
one purpose: A CHANCE TO
LIVE!” . Damstrom stated. St. 
Jude’s dramatic progress has been 
made possible primarily by volun­
teer contributions raised through 
events such as the Wheels for Life 
Bike-A-Thon.

Danny Thomas, who founded St. 
Jude Children’s Research Hospi'a'

because of a vow, stated its purpose 
dearly: “ To wipe catastrophic
diseases of children from the face of 
the earth."

"Since Thomas opened the re­
search center in 1962, his dream of 
conquering cancer and other dis­
eases that destroy our children has 
been brought closer to reality." 
stated Damstrom. "Thomas is still 
extremely active in pursuing this 
goal, and he inspires all of us in this 
cause."

Details of the Bike Ride will be 
announced later.

State sales tax to 
increase Oct. 2nd
New tax laws passed by the 

Legislature and signed by Governor 
Mark White go into effect October
2 .

The state sales tax goes up 1/8 of 
a cent across the state, but it 
translates into a 4 1/8 percent sales 
tax. In some cities that have local 
sales taxes and special taxes for 
mass transit, the cost may balloon 
to as much as 6 1/8 percent.

Many items that have never been 
taxed, will appear on the tax list, 
along with higher taxes on some 
items already carrying tax status.

Fertilizer used for non-agricul- 
tural purposes will be taxes. Other 
garden items such as bedding 
plants bought at nurseries and 
plants bought at the grocery store 
are subject to the higher tax rate. 
Exempt from th tax are annual 
plants that die after a growth year 
or that yield food for human 
consumption. Fertilizer used for 
agricultural purposes remains 
exempt. Newspaper subscriptions 
are included in the list. Starting 
October 2, papers you buy at news 
stands, grocery stores or receive 
through the mail will be taxed.

The cost o f repairing personal 
property, including home repairs 
such as washing machines, dryers, 
lawn mowers, vacuum clearners, 
microwave ovens, telephones and 
television sets are all included. 
Also included are the extended 
warranties consumers buy to pro­
tect these items. Repairs to real 
estate are not taxed. Neither are 
repairs to items that are specifically 
exempt, such as eye glasses or 
hearing aids, motor vehicles and 
aircrafts. Parts are taxed, but not 
the repair work itself.

If your watch breaks or if your 
camera’s shutter is on the blink, 
their repair is taxable at the place 
where you take them to get them 
fixed.

Sports tickets, along with tickets 
to most other entertainment and 
recreational events come under the 
Texas sales tax for the first. 
(As far as we know at this time, this 
does not include high school 
sports.)

The coming attraction at local

Craft to attend TCU

ranch Management 

Program

John Robert Craft of Garendon 
was among 35 young ranchers from 
eight states and Canada. Guate­
mala and Brazil selected to attend 
Texas Christian University's 1984- 
85 Ranch Management Program.

The unique nine-month program 
combines intensive classroom study 
of all aspects of ranching with 
10,000 miles o f travel each year to 
examine principles and practices 
applied on working ranches.

The new class includes men and 
women from Texas. Arkansas, New 
Mexico, Florida. Pennsylvania, 
Wyoming. California and Louisi­
ana. They join some 700 ranchers 
from 33 states and 21 foreign 
countries who have taken part in the 
program.

Don Ray featured in 

Accent West Magazine
An area artist and Garendon 

native is featured in a regional 
magazine this month.

Don Ray, Wester artist born in 
Clarendon, is one o f several area 
artists featured in the September 
issue of Accent west Magazine, a 
regional magazine for the Texas 
Panhandle.

Ray, who now lives in Channing, 
is one o f three area Western artists 
from the Texas Panhandle to join in 
the debate concerning Western art 
versus abstract art in this month's 
cover story entitled Art Wars. 
Ray is joined by Justin Wells and 
Stefan Kramar, both o f Amarillo.

Representing the abstract artists 
are Steve Mayes of West Texas 
State University, William Burrell of

Amarillo College and Denny Fraze, 
also, of Amarillo College.

While the abstract artists criticize 
Western art for lack of composition 
and putting more emphasis on 
subject matter than technique, the 
Western artists counter by accusing 
the abstract artists of a lack of 
drawing talent.

"1 particularly like the act of 
putting down an idea that I have in 
my head, a mental concept or a 
character," said Ray.

Accent West Magazine is 
published monthly in Amarillo. 
Featuring stories for and about the 
people of the Texas Panhandle. 
Accent West is available at 
newsstands or by subscription.

be
to

higher
movie

movie theatres may 
priced. Admissions 
houses and to almost entertainment 
event will be taxed under the new 
sales tax law, including cable TV.

Tobacco products get a double­
dose of taxes. Texans will have to 
pay both a sales tax and a tobacco 
products tax. The tobacco products 
tax went up by 1 % to 19.5 cents per 
pack. But for the first time, 
cigarettes, cigars, chewing and pipe 
tobaccos will fall under the tax 
structure. Additionally, the 
vending machine price of cigar­
ettes - already higher than the 
over-the-counter price will inch 
even higher. A pack of cigarettes 
out of a machine costs about *1.25.

A laundry list of new items will be 
subject to the tax. The most 
common type o f bill is dry cleaning 
personal clothing. It also will 
include employee uniforms or 
linens such as tablecloths or cotton 
napkins sent out to be cleaned. 
Drapes that are repaired or steam 
cleaned also will be taxed. If you 
have upholstery cleaned or re­
paired, valet services at hotels and 
other ironing or pressing services 
you will also pay tax on these 
services. Not affected are coin- 
operated laundry machines 
operated by consumers.

This list is only part o f the taxable 
items the *4.8 billion tax package 
includes. How much of the new tax 
burden will fall on you depends on 
what you buy and where you live.

Questions regarding any of the 
new taxes can be answered by 
calling State Comptroller Bob Bul­
lock's office toll free. 1-800-252- 
5555 or on the regular number 
512-475-1931.

Paper subscription 

to be taxed 

beginning Oct. 2
Subscriptions will be taxed under 

the new law passed by Legislature 
and signed by Governor Mark 
White when the law goes into effect 
October 2. You will have to pay a 
penny more for your paper at news 
stands and grocery stores. Starting 
in October you will pay 10:00 plus 
51 cents tax for your yearly sub­
scription in Donley County and 
*13.00 plus 67 cents tax on sub­
scriptions outside of the county.Q

If you know your paper is 
expiring soon, you might want to 
consider paying your subscription a 
little early to avoid the tax. If you 
do pay early your paper will be 
continued from the date it was due.

Sesquicentennial
Notes

Pledge of Allegiance to the Texas 
Flag: "Honor the Texas Rag. I
pledge allegiance to the Texas one 
and indivisable. ”

The provision for a salute to the 
Texas flag was made when the 
Texas legislature passed a law for 
the salute and a series o f rules on 
the proper use of the banner in 
1932.

Interest in the Texas History 
class offered by Garendon College 
is high with enrollment continuing. 
Hedley is well represented with a 
good number o f citizens from that 
community all ready attending 
class. Some class members are first 
time students, some are "second 
time around" and some are 
originally out of state residents who 
are interested.

Senior Citizens will have their 
dance September 18, 8 p.m .-ll 
p.m. in the Garendon Community 
Center where there is plenty of 
room and plenty of seats. There 
will be live music.

5th Tumbleweed 
Talent show

The search is now on for entries 
into the Fifth Annual "Tumbleweed 
Talents Show,”  which will be held 
in the Garendon College Fine Arts 
Theatre, Saturday. September 29, 
at 7:00 p.m.

Individuals and groups of all ages 
are encouraged to enter the talent 
contest and participate in this 
wonderful evening of family enter­
tainment. ENTRY DEADLINE is 
September 17. .

Perhaps you sing or have an 
amateur musical group. Maybe you 
love to impersonate famous people 
or give comedy routines or dramatic 
readings, ft could be that you play 
the piano, guitar, or some other 
instrument, or perhaps you ar a 
music or voice teacher with some 
talented students who would like to 
perform.

Do your school cheerleaders or 
twirlers have a really super routine 
to share with area residents? Do 
you have a dance troop who would 
really like to "show their stuff"?

Proceeds will go toward student 
scholarships for Texas Panhandle 
students by the sponsoring clubs, 
the Green Masque Drama Gub and 
the PTK National Honor Society

Entry forms may be obtained by 
calling (806) 874-2574 or (806) 
874-2389 or bv writing CLAREN­
DON COLLEGE. TUMBLEWEED 
TALENTS. BOX 968. CLAREN 
DON, TX 79226.

Trophies and prizes are awarded 
to winners in 6 age divisions. 
Write or call today for an entry form 
for you. your group, or someone you 
would like to encourage to share 
their talent at TUMBLEWEED 
TALENTS on September 29.

Billy Price hurt 
in accident

Billy Price, an employee of Knee 
Super Save, was injured Thursday. 
September 6th when a truck tire he 
was fixing exploded. The impact of 
the tire broke both of his hands, 
both wrists and a bone in his arm 
between his elbow and shoulder. 
He had a large scalp wound and 
severed an artery in his arm.

Pat Robertson of the Emergencv 
Medical Service, credited the quick 
action of Dr. Devhle in saving 
Price's life. The ambulance was on 
the scene within 5 minutes, but in 
that length of time. Price could have 
bled to death.

He was taken to Dr. Gilkev's 
Ginic then transported to North­
west Texas Hospital where he 
underwent surgery

He is reportedly out of intensive 
care.

Mooring, Price receive 
degrees from WT

Two Garendon residents have 
been awarded bachelor's degrees 
during summer commencement 
ceremonies at West Texas State 
Universitv.

Receiving degrees are Darlene 
Mooring, Bachelor of Arts in 
English education with a second 
major in speech education, and 
Ricky Price. Bachelor of Science in 

vuucduuii wiui a second 
major in history education.

Of the 362 candidates for gradua­
tion. 128 received master's de­
grees. Bachelor's and master's 
degrees at WTSU are awarded in 
the School of Agriculture, College 
of Arts and Sciences. School of 
Business. College of Education, 
School of Fine Arts and School of 
Nurting.
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Formway named
Academic
All-American

The National Secondary Educa­
tion Council announced today that 
Kim Formway has been named an 
Academic All-American.

The NSEC has established the 
Academic Atl-American Scholar 
Award Program in order to offer 
deserved recognition to superior

students who excel in the Academic 
disciplines. The Academic All- 
American Scholars must earn a 3.3 
or better grade point average. 
Only Scholars selected by a second­
ary school instructor, counselor, or 
other qualified sponsor are ac­
cepted. These scholars are also 
eligible for other awards given by 
the NSEC. These are awards few 
students can ever hope to attain.

Kim Formway who attends 
Clarendon High School, was 
nominated for this national award 
by Betty Veach, Business education 
teacher. Kim will appear in the 
Academic All-American Scholar 
Directory, which is published na­
tionally.

“ Recognizing and supporting our 
youth is more important than ever 
before in American history. Cer­
tainly, winners o f the Academic 
All-American Awards should be 
congratulated and appreciated for 
their dedication to excellence and 
achievement,”  said Dr. George 
Stevens, Executive Director o f the 
National Secondary Education 
Council.

The Council selects Academic 
All-American Scholars upon the 
exclusive recommendations of 
teachers, coaches, counselors, and 
other qualified sponsors. Once 
awarded, the students may be 
recognized by the NSEC for other

The
honors.

Kim is the daughter o f Jim and 
Jeannic Formway. The grand­
parents are Lee and Gene Welch of 
Oarendon and A.L. "Loc”  and 
Myrtle Formway o f Panhandle, 
Texas.

Rattan selected as

Academic
All-American
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The National Secondary Educa­
tion Council announced today that 
D'Lynn Rattan has been named an 
Academic All-American. The 
NSEC has established the Aca­
demic All-American Scholar Award 
Program in order to offer deserved 
recognition to superior students 
who excel in the Academic dis­
ciplines. The Academic All- 
American Scholars must earn a 3.3 
or better grade point average. 
Only Scholars selected by a 
secondary school instructor, coun­
selor, or other qualified sponsor are 
accepted. These scholars are also 
eligible for other awards given by 
the NSEC. These are awards few 
students can ever hope to attain.

D ’Lynn Rattan who attends 
Clarendon Junior College was 
nominated for this National Award 
by Betty Veach. D'Lynn Rattan will 
a pear in the Academic All-Ameri­
can Scholar Directory, which is 
published nationally.

"Recognizing and supporting our 
youth is more important than ever 
before in American history. Cer­
tainly, winners o f the Academic 
All-American Awards should be 
congratulated and appreciated for 
their dedication to excellence and 
achievement,”  said Dr. George 
Stevens, Executive Director o f the 
National Secondary Education 
Council.

The Council selects Academic 
All-American Scholars upon the 
exclusive recommendations o f
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teachers, coaches, counselors, and 
other qualified sponsors. Once 
awarded, the students may be 
recognized by the NSEC for other 
honors.

D’Lynn Rattan is the daughter of 
M i. and Mrs. John Rattan. The 
grandparents are Roeda Rattan of 
Clarendon and Mr. and Mrs. J.J. 
Griffin o f McAdoo, Texas.
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As we continue our series on 
“ Revival God’s Way” , 1 want to 
take this weeks article to ask the 
question “ Do we really need re­
vival?’ * After all, a recent Gallup 
poll indicated that over 60 million 
Americans claim to have had a 
“ born again experience.”  Even the 
secular press has drawn attention to 
a so-called resurgance o f evan­
gelical Christianity. W e live in a 
day o f “ super churches”  with 
“ super programs” . We boast of 
the best television and radio 
programs, the beat missions' 
programs, the best preachers and 
preaching that the world has ever 
known I

But ironically, while we have 
been offering our “ best,”  we have 
at the same time seen a dramatic 
acceleration o f crime, moral per­
version, and self-centered, hedonis­
tic living in our society. If the 
church is so strong and healthy, 
why isn’t it, like salt and light, 
making a greater impact on the 
world in which we live?

The pure, committed. Spirit-filled 
lifestyle of the early church caused 
the fear of God in fall on the 
unbelieving world. Drawn by the 
power o f the Holy Spirit, quite apart 
from gimmicks, prizes, and contest, 
lost people flocked to find the 
Saviour. Could we honestly say that 
even our biggest and beat soul­
winning programs are producing 
that kind of interest?

Do we really need revival? Look 
at the contention, competition, and 
conflict that characterize many of 
our churches. Are these the marks 
o f a healthy church?

You see, if the essence of 
Christianity is merely knowing the 
right things and doing the right 
things, then maybe we’re doing all 
right. But the truth is that God 
keeps the record book on the heart. 
He knows how many o f us know 
right and do right, while covering 
up hearts that aren’t right. True 
spirituality is measured not to much 
by what we know and what we do 
(as important as these are), but by 
what we really are. And what we 
really are is revealed by our 
attitudes-how we respond and react 
in real life situations.

We may be able to impress each 
other with our knowledge of the 
Bible, but God is not impressed if 
what we know o f His Word has not 
radically transformed the way we 
live and think and respond.

Do we really need revival? Per­
haps not, if spirituality is soiey 
measured by how actively involved 
we are in the Church’s programs. 
But if God is looking for people 
whose hearts are pure, whose 
consciences are dear, and who are 
practidng Spirit-filled living, then I 
believe that our need for revival is 
critical and urgent.

when God turns the 
His Word and His 

holiness on our lives and churches, 
the easiest response is to slap a coat 
o f religious cosmetic paint on our 
failures, pat ourselves on the back, 
tell ourselves how wonderful every­
thing is, keep pumping ourselves 
up in the energy o f the flesh, keep 
acting like everything la all right, 
and hope that nobody ever dis­
covers the “ dead men’s bones”  

lie underneath all our beauti­
fully whitewashed tombstones.

But, oh how we need to humble 
ourselves, get honest and agree 
with God about our true spiritual 
condition, fall on our facet before 

in repentance, and cry out to 
Him for the reviving, restoring 
ministry o f His Spirit in our midst.

Yes. we need revival, but we 
need it God's way and not ours.

Next week we will discuss “ The 
kind o f Revival we need.”

Burgess-Boothe engagement 
announced
Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Burgess of 

Clarendon announce the engage­
ment o f their daughter, Karen, to 
Gary Mark Boothe, son o f Mr. snd 
Mrs. Melvin Boothe of Lubbock. 
The ceremony will be November 3 
at the First United Methodist 
Church in Childress. Miss Burgess 
is a graduate o f Abilene Christian

Hodges appointed 
Salvation Army
Billy D. Hodges has been ap­

pointed Donley County Salvation 
Army Service Chairman, Paul 
Bivens has been named campaign 
chairman and Bronnie McNabb. Jr. 
serves as treasurer.

The Salvation Army has been 
providing gifts to the needy for over 
100 years. A volunteer donation is 
being solicited from businesses and 
individuals to support the welfare 
programs, disaster relief and 
summer camps provided by the 
Salvation Army.

Local Salvation Army Service

University and ia currently an 
Electric Living Consultant with 
West Texas Utilities Company in 
Childress. Her fiance, a graduate 
of Texas Tech University, is pre­
sently a Petroleum Engineer for 
Amoco Oil Production Company in 
Odessa. Both are graduates of 
Clarendon High School.

chairman of

Unit also provides assistance to 
stranded travelers and assistance to 
others in need locally.

Allen Estlack, William J. Lowe, 
M.O. Weatherly, Jerry Hawkins, 
Clarence Hamilton, W.R. Christa! 
and Rev. Bill Watson serve on the 
board with Hodges, Bivens and 
McNabb. ,

The Donley County Salvation 
Army Service Unit needs support, 
both financially and volunteers for 
their campaign. If  you would like to 
make a donation, you may contact 
any member of the committee.
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Steer and Lamb Project

4th

Seven! Donley County 4-H 'ei. 
exhibited tteer and lamb projects at 
the Tri-State Fair in Amarillo 
August 31-September 3, according 
to County Extension Agent Ronald 
Gooch.

In the lamb show, Shannon 
Myers placed 11th with a light 
weight and 12th with a middle 
weight in the medium wool breeds.

In the steer show, English Breeds 
feeder division, Class I, Lori Rober­
son placed 10th, Todd Roberson 
16th, and Nugget Bland 19th. In 
Class 2, Lisa Burch placed 6th, 
Jason Klinnert 8th, Trad Burch 
12th, Bridget Bland 14th and 22nd, 
Shane Klinnert 17th, and Scott 
Myers 21st.

In the market division o f the steer

Ifcn
show, Jason Klinnert placed 
and Lesia Fuston 5th and 9th.

In the Junior Heifer show o f the 
Tri-State Fair held September 4-8, 
the following 4-H’ers competed: 
Lisa and Trad Burch, Christie and 
Laura McAnear, Ginger and Kevin 
McAnear, Jason and Shane Klin­
nert, Donald Caocli, and Lesia 
Fuston.

4-H’wu exhibit at fair
Severn! Donley County 4-H’ers 

exhibited Shorthorn heifers at the 
Tri-State Fair in Amarillo, Sep­
tember 4-8, according to County 
Extension Agent Ronald Gooch. 
The 4-H’ers exhibited in the Junior

13,1984
show and the open show. The first 
placing is for the Junior show, 
followed by open show placing.

Class I, Junior Heifer Calves, 
Laura McAnear 1st, 2nd.

Class 2, Winter Heifer Calves, 
Laura McAnear, 2nd, 3rd.

Class 3, Senior Heifer Calves, 
Ginger McAnear 2nd, 6th; Jason 
Klinnert 3rd, 7th; Kevin McAnear 
9th in the open show.

Class 4, Summer Yearling 
Heifers, Shane Klinnert 3rd, 5th; 
Christie McAnear 4th, 6th; Donald
Gooch 5th, 7th.

Claas 5, Late Spring Yearlings, 
Laura McAnear 1st, 1st.

Gass 6, Early Spring Yearlings, 
Kevin McAnear, 6th in the open 
show.

Gass 7, Junior Yearlings, Chris­
tie McAnear. 1st, 1st; Trad Burch,

2nd, 2nd.
Gass 8, Senior Yearlings, Trad 

Burch 1st, 1st.
Class 9, Group of two females,

Laura McAnear 2nd; Christie 
McAnear 3rd.

Christie McAnear also exhibited 
the senior champion female o f the 
open show, and Trad Burch the 
reserve senior champion heifer.
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If you’re looking for the best in name brand auto parts, then come into Green 
Light and say hello

We’ve got the biggest selection of top brand auto parts at everyday low prices 
And our parts professionals are always ready to help. Especially when you're 
looking tor that hard to find part. Even if we don’t have it in stock, chances are we 
can h»re it for you the next day Without charging you an arm and a leg 

So oome into Green Light and get acquainted with the best parts, the friendliest 
service and the most competitive prices around We re your Green Light Auto­
motive Store —  Here to help you Do-it-Right

FLO YD 'S  AUTOM OTIVE SU PPLY
219 S. Sully, Clarendon 874-27SS

_ DO rr RIGHT WITH
H  GREEN U G H T * A »

AUTOMOTIVE STORES

A u m i Im L U  —4 M  n , l  i n i  rail |>M«nvaiiuDit or moil KtCunoni.

’IS

Vr*u art- cordially iijviwd lo 
|*sx mston.
(. tuque ra«hu>ns for the 
•,< >phi»iK,W 'd w in u n  
l.omiorabk' surrounding'
f t  rvun.ll w r v it c

___■ .1..: . ■■

W o m e n 's  F a s h io n s  . . .
M o r e  t i t a n  IV a d h io n a l

1701 Paramount • Amarillo, leva* 
358 245-

o p e n  lo-.OO a .w  —- S tjil p .m . 
After hour.* by appointment

THE 
MATURITY 
DATE FOR 

YOUR 
C.D.

The choice is yours. Select two weeks from the date of 
deposit, or up to five years. New legislation pertaining to 
banks now allows you to select the exact date of maturity 
on Certificates of Deposit.

Minimum requirements are 14 days for deposits of 
$100,000 or more and 32 days or longer on smaller 
deposits. (Penalty for early withdrawal.)

Obtain Money Market rates on CD s with a minimum 
deposit of $1,000.

All deposits insured to $100,000 by the FDIC and your 
money stays in Clarendon

F i r s t  B r i t i -i <Tir u s t

FDICO F C LAR EN D O N



Leila Lake reunion planned 
for Oct. 20

p lia M l ter Saturday, October 20th, 
19A4 at 2.-00 p.m. at the Letts Lake

Letts Lake School.
A  catered a e t l  la being plaonad

ter 6:00 p.ai. The oaat o f the a ra l 
wtt be approximately <5.00 to 
<6.00. Too will not seed to tend 

M i l  thU time. Urn 
the an th er at 
to attend the

to: Earl Shields.
Texas 79240, 

<06-074-3793, or 
Floyd. Box 590.

Tasaa 79226. phone 
874-3374.

yoa
old and

tike to share

> plan to come. Th iaw illbe 
a joyous time ter aO.

BRIGHT NEWHOUSE 
has completed all the 

requirements to 

be certified as a 

QUALIFYING MEMBER 
OF THE 
1984

MILLION DOLLAR ROUND TABLE
an independent association of life insurance agents, 

each of whom must meet strict ethical and production 

requirements in order to qualify. Recognized 

internationally as the standard of life insurance sales 

performance, only 3V» of the world's life insurance agents 

qualify for the M DRT each year through high level client 

service and production.

Am erican!
A  -  L I  /  IN S U R A N C E

n m iC B D lB  / COMPANY
Fifth U Austin, Waco. Tsxss 76703

PUBLIC  NOTICE
B R I E F  E X P L A N A T O R Y  S T A T E M E N T S  

O F  P R O P O S E D

C O N S T I T U T I O N A L  A M E N D M E N T S
GENERAL ELECTION  

NOVEMBER 6. 1984

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
ON THE BALLOT

House Joint Resolution 29 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that provides to state-chartered 
banks ths same rights and privi­
leges that are or may be granted 
to national banks o f the United 
States domiciled in this state. For 
example, i f  national banka become 
authorisisd to maintain branch o f­
fices, this amendment would extend 
the same privilege to state banks. 

The proposed constitutional 
amendment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ The constitu­
tional amendment to provide 
state banks the same rights and 
privileges as^ national banks.”

PROPOSITION NO. 2 
ON THE BALLOT

House Joint Resolution 19 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that restructures the Permanent 
University Fund to provide: (1 ) 
fo r the expansion o f the institutions 
eligible to participate in the bond­
ing capacity of the fund to include 
the components o f The University 
o f Texas and Texas AAM  Univer­
sity systems that have been added 
to those two systems o f higher 
education since the Permanent Uni­
versity Fund was last restructured 
by constitutional amendment; (2) 
for the expansion o f the purposes 
for whieh bond proceeds can be ex­
pended from new construction to 
include major repair and rehabili­
tation projects and the acquisition 
o f major capital equipment (e .g , 
computers and laboratory equip­
ment) and library books and mate­
rials; (8 ) for an increase in the 
bonding capacity from 20% (%  for 
The University o f Texas System 
and M tor  the Texas AAM  Univer­
sity System) to 80% (20% for The 
University o f Texas System and 
10% for Texas AAM  University 
System) o f the value of the assets 
(exclusive o f real estate) in the 
Permanent University Fund in or­
der to provide sufficient bond pro­
ceeds to care for the addition o f 10 
new institutions to those authorised 
to participate in the Permanent 
University Fund bonding program 
and to care for the expanded pur­
poses for which the bond proceeds 
can be spent; and (4 ) for the dedi­
cation of the dividends, interest, and 
other income from the Permanent 
University Fund remaining after 
payment o f principal and interest 
due on bonds and notes issued, to the 
provision o f support and mainte­
nance (over and above normal leg­
islative appropriations) for Texas 
AAM  University in Brasos County, 
Prairie View AAM  University, and 
The University o f Texas at Austin.

House Joint Resolution 19 also an­
nually appropriates (100 million in 
euch fiscal year, beginning Septem­
ber 1, 1MB (from the first money 
coming into the state treasury that is 
net otherwise appropriated hv the 
constitution) f " r  the use o f those

education which are not included in 
The University o f Texas or Texas 
AAM  University Systems and, there­
fore, not eligible to participate in the 
Permanent University Fund bond­
ing program. The amount o f this 
appropriation could be adjusted 
every five years by a % vote of 
the Legislature, but could not be 
adjusted in such a way as to affect 
outstanding bonding indebtedness. 
Each institution of higher educa­
tion that is eligible to participate 
(i.e., those institutions o f higher 
education outside The University of 
Texas and Texas AAM  University 
Systems) would be authorised to 
expend directly its share (such 
share to be determined pursuant to 
an equitable formula) of the $100 
million appropriation for the pur­
poses o f acquiring land, construct­
ing and equipping buildings or oth­
er permanent improvements, msjor 
repair and rehabilitation o f other 
permanent buildings or improve­
ments, and acquisition o f major 
capital equipment (e.g., computers 
and laboratory equipment) and 
library books and materials. Addi­
tionally, each institution would be 
authorised to issue bonds backed by 
a pledge o f up to 60% o f its share 
o f the $100 million annual appro­
priation to t  the purpose o f land 
acquisition, new construction, and 
major repair and rehabilitation 
projects.

Except in the case o f fire or 
natural disaster and in other extra­
ordinary cases, verified by a two- 
thirds vote o f each house o f the 
legislature, all institutions of high­
er education would be precluded 
from receiving appropriations of 
general revenue funds for the pur­
poses o f land acquisition, new con­
struction, and major repair and 
rehabilitation projects.

The proposed amendment will 
appear on the ballot as follows: 
uln e  constitutional amendment 
to create from general revenue a 
special higher education assis­
tance fund for construction and 
related activities, to restructure 
the Permanent University Fund, 
and to increase the number o f 
institutions eligible to benefit 
from the Permanent University 
Fund.”

PROPOSITION NO. S 
ON THE BALLOT

House Joint Resolution 66 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
which authorises the legislature to 
provide for the payment o f assis­
tance to the surviving dependent 
parent*, brothers, and sisters o f o f­
ficers, employees and agent* o f the 
state or its political subdivisions, 
including members o f organised 
volunteer fire  departments and 
members o f organised police reserve 
or auxiliary unit* authorised to 
make arrests, who die in the course 
o f performing hazardous official 
du.ies. Payments to surviving 
spouses nod iV|tM»drnt rhildren o f 
agencies and institutions « f  higher

such officers, employees, and agents 
are already authorised by the Con­
stitution.

The proposed amendment will 
appear on the ballot as follows: 
“ The constitutional amendment 
authorising the legislature to pro­
vide for payment o f assistance to 
the surviving dependent parents, 
brothers, and sisters e f certain 
public servants killed while on 
duty.”

PROPOSITION NO. 4 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution SO pro- 
posts s constitutional amendment 
which abolishes the office o f county 
treasurer in Bexar and Collin coun­
ties i f  u majority o f the voters in 
euch o f those counties vote in favor 
o f abolishing the office o f county 
treasurer in a local election te. be 
held on the issue. A ll the powers, 
duties, and functions e f the office 
o f county treasurer in each e f these 
counties would be transferred te 
the county clerk.

The proposed constitutional 
amendment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ The constitu­
tional amendment to abolish the 
office o f county treasurer ia 
Bexar and Collin countiea.”

PROPOSITION NO. 5 
ON THE BALLOT

Senate Joint Resolution 22 pro. 
poses a constitutional amendment 
which provides a new method e f 
filling a vacancy in the office o f 
Lieutenant Governor. The amend­
ment requires the President pro 
tempore o f the Senate to eell to­
gether the committee o f the whole 
Senate within 80 days after a 
vacancy occurs in the office o f Lieu­
tenant Governor. The committee 
would be required to elect one o f 
its members to perform the duties 
o f the Lieutenant Governor until 
the next general election. This In­
dividual would continue his duties as 
Senator at the same time that he 
performs the Lieutenant Governor’ s 
duties. I f  the Senator who is elected 
ceases to be a Senator before the 
next general election, another Sena­
tor must be elected according to the 
above procedure to perform the Lieu­
tenant Governor’s duties. The Presi­
dent pro tempore would be re­
quired to perform the Lieutenant 
Governor’s duties pending the elec­
tion of one o f its members by the 
committee o f the whole Senate.

The proposed amendment will 
appear on the ballot as follows: 
“ The constitutional amendment 
authorising the state senate to 
fill a vacancy in the office o f 
lieutenant governor.”

PROPOSITION NO. 4 
ON THE BALLOT

House Joint Resolution 78 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
that permits the use of public funds 
and credit for payment o f premi­
ums on non-assessabt* life, health, 
or accident insurance policies and 
annuity contracts issued by u mu­
tual insurance company authorised 
to do business in this state. The con­
stitutional prohibition against a 
grant o f public money to an individ­
ual. association, or corporation or 
against becoming a stockholder in a 
corporation, association, or com­
pany has limited life  and health 
group policies o f political subdivi­
sions to non-mutual insurance com­
panies. The amendment would per­
mit mutual insurance companies to 
bid for those policies.

The proposed constitutional 
amendment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: The constitu­
tional amendment to permit use 
o f public funds and erudit for 
payment o f premiums on certain 
insurance contracts o f mutual 
insurance companies authorised 
to do business in Texas."

PROPOSITION NO. 7 
ON THE BALLOT

House Joint Resolution 4 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
to change the membership e f the 
State Commission on Judicial Con­
duct to include one Judge e f a Mu­
nicipal Court and one Judge o f u 
County Court at Law, who shall be 
selected at large and appointed by 
the Supreme Court with the advice 
and consent o f the Senate.

The amendment also provides 
additional grounds for removal from 
office o f judges or justice* o f Texas 
courts, and provides additional dis­
ciplinary actions that could he taken 
in lieu o f removal or censure. The 
amendment would extend the Com­
mission’s disciplinary authority te 
musters, magistrates, and retired 
or former judgee who hear cases 
by designation. The amendment 
creates a tribunal to review recom­
mendations o f the State Commission 
on Judicial Conduct for removal or 
retirement e f  a Judge or justice. The 
review tribunal would be composed 
o f seven (7 ) Justices or Judges of 
the Courts o f Appeals selected by kit 
by the Chief Justice o f the Supreme 
Court. The amendment ala* provide* 
for appeal o f the review tribunal’s 
decision to the Supreme Court o f 
Texas and grants an accused judge 
th# right to discovery o f evidence. 

The prepositien will appear on 
the ballot as follows: The con­
stitutional amendment relating to 
the membership o f th* State 
Commission on Judicial Conduct 
and the authority and procedure 
to discipline active judges, cur­
tain retired and former judges, 
and curtain masters and magis­
trates o f th* courts.”

PROPOSITION NO. 8 
ON THE BALLOT

House Joint Rcoolution 82 pro­
poses a constitutional amendment 
which increases th* per diem e f 
members o f th* Legislature. The 
amount o f per diem allowed during 
a calendar year would be aqua! to 
th* maximum amount cut in federal 
income tax statutes as o f  January 
I  o f that tamo year aa a deduction 
for ordinary and necessary business 
expenses incurred by a state legisla­
tor. Current per diem is <80; the 
maximum deduction is now <76.

Th* proposed constitutional 
amendment will appear on the 

* 6 0 110 1 as follows: "The constitu­
tional amendment to provide a 
per diem for members e f the leg­
islature equal to the maximum 
daily amount allowed by federal 
law aa a deduction for ordinary 
and necessary business expenses 
incurred byt a state legislator.”
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Discountcenter

Rnsnrvo right to limit g v n t ity  Somo itooit not oxoctly « i  lllostratod
Sondny t  a.m. - 7 p.m. Monday • Satorday •  a .o . ■ 7 p.n .

T O P  O U A I IT Y .. .
9nr

Roman Meal Sandwich

Bread
1 Vi Lb

Country Hearth Butter 
top Wheat 1 Vi Lb

Bread

Orange Drink Mix

TANG
27 Oz

• r

«  S U P E R  S A V IN O S
Celebrate Liberty

i  s i  N e s t le

rQuUC

4a 1

M dKV a t e

Nestle

2DAYS ONLY r n d . ,  ONLY
All mooofactoror's coupons 97* and ondor oxclodln^ 
tobacco and free coopons will bo rodoomod for
doabla valoa Tborsday and Friday only (Dooblo 
valao of coopon c a n n o t oxcood tho valoo of tho Its 
- Ono coopon par itom plooso -

Tasters Choice Instant

Coffee 8 0z
Tasters Choice Instant 8 Oz

Coffee Decaf
Nestle Chocolate 32 Oz can

Q uik M ix  :
Nestle Quik Chocolate

Syrup 22 0z Btl
Nestle Chocolate 12 O z  _

Chip M orsels $ 1 68
Appian way

P izza  M ix  ^ < ^ 6 8 c
Armour’ s Luncheon Meat ^

Tree* »o, * | l ®

B A N A N A S
V 1

Lb V

00 i
Green

CABBAGE
Green

. ONIONS '
A  White

* ONIONS

;  'S k
\

A;A- ' -

VS 'A

Lb

Ranch Style 15 Oz With Jalapenos

p in t o  i i a n s 3 / 9 8 ‘
J S to KAifijJ RanchStyle 15 OzKanchStyle lb  Oz

PINTO  B IA N S  3 / 9 8 *
2 Oz Pkg

Spud-Kits Instant

POTATOES
Log Cabin

SYRUP & Pitcher 24 Oz

Baby Tendercook

L IM A  BEANS >* ^
Tendercook 16 Oz

BLACKEYE PEAS 3 8 C 
PINTO BEANS 2 8 !

Little Friskies Dry Gourmet or Fish 3 ^  Lb Bag

CAT FOOD $2 ”
^  ^  Friskies 6 Vi Oz

A T FOOD
Mighty 6Vi Oz

DOG FOOD 3 /$l°°

Gold Medal

FLOUR
Hills Bros.

4/98

38c I OLEO

M i PURPOSE

COFFEE
^ ^ ■ 3 8 hills

.BROS

16 Oz

Contadiana

Tomato Sauce 15 Oz 3/99*
Parkay Light Spread Clin ken (’it-

Solo Cold 16 Oz

CUPS 20 Ct Pkg

TV 10 Lb Bag

CHARCOAL $167
Gulf Charcoal

LIGHTER Qt $167

Stillwell Frozen Fruit

COBBLER 32o, M 58
Banquet Frozen

Q ra P O T PUS 3 /9 9 '
ttLcSb Cole’ s Garlic Frozen

IREAD 16 02
10 Oz Cut TV Whole Frozen

rr'C O R N  3/89
Towels

BOUNTY u Ron
Bathroom Tissue ^

WHITE W 4 
CLOUD 8 V*IICW:

Blade Cut USDA Choice Beef

CHUCK ROAST
$

•*rlJ ; - f t

SHORT RIBS 
SAKINO HENS

t nt«

Lean & Meaty 

Country Prid* *» to 7 Lbs

smoked

4P

W '

SLICED PICNICS
Tyson s 8 Oz

CHICKEN LIVERS 
SMOKED PICNICS ^  u, w

9 8 *  8

8 8 *
3 /9 8

Li>

iV Brand 8 0 /



Hedley Happenings
Things are rolling right along 

getting ready for the Thirty-third 
Annual Cotton Festival. According 
to M.O. Weatherly, the Carnival 
will be here. The businesses have 
started building their fleets and the 
girls running for queen ate busy 
selling tickets. I don’t know just 
exactly what the boys expect to get 
out o f it, but there are at least two 
boys selling tickets. Maybe 
Thunder intends to be the first 
Cotton Festival King!, I personally 
am looking forward to the parade. 
I think the flouts in the parade are 
as pretty as any I have seen 
anywhere. I know that a lot o f hard 
wort goes into the making o f those 
floats. 1 always look forward to 
seeing what new idea Sue Weather­
ly has come up with. She has 
planned, built, decorated, and 
shown some o f the most beautiful 
floats in the world.

Bob and Jessie Boland spent the 
weekend with their son, Bobby and 
Pat Boland in Amarillo. Jessie 
allows as how she and Pat walked a 
thousand miles while Bob and 
Bobby kept the television occupied.

Paula Clendennen o f McLean 
visited her parents, Tom and Opal 
Clendennen last week. She was on 
her way to Amarillo on Business. 
Tony went along for the ride.

Opal’s other son. Tommy and 
Carolyn, stopped by on their way to 
Possum Kingdom Lake on vacation. 
They expect to bring home a lot of 
fish. If Tommy brings home any 
fish, it will beat what he used to do,

L.C. and June Johnson received a 
nice write-up in the Lighthouse 
Electric News about their Bhema 
Ranch Country Store. The store is 
located five miles south of Hedley at 
Giles. If there's anyone who hasn’t 
visited the store, they should do so. 
It’ s nice and clean, the people are 
friendly, and the food is good. I 
understand their ice cream is worth 
the trip down or up as the case 
might be. In my case, I guess it’ s 
over, since the store is just across 
Highway 287 from the ranch. My 
boys have probably bought a 
hundred gallons o f ice cream this 
summer.

Mrs. Nettie Alexander is in El 
Paso with her daughter, Mrs. 
Bonnie Lesley. Faye Naylor took 
her to the airport in Amarillo 
Monday.

Fred and I took our boys, Keith 
and Guy, to the fair in Amarillo 
Wednesday. Keith Brinson, Calvin 
Holland, and Kelly Harmon went 
with us. When we got ready to 
come home, I thought part of us 
would have to hitch-hike. Those

boys had the back o f that pickup full 
to overflowing with ‘ valuable 
prizes’ they had won mostly by 
tossing basketballs. Mr. Collins 
would have been proud o f the way 
they were putting those balls 
through the basket. My mother, 
Mrs. Lola Brown, went with us.

We saw John and Mary Farris. 
Shane and Otis and Neil Taylor at 
the fair. We also visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Tollitt o f Follett and 
Richard Stotts. Earl and Bichard 
had their cattle entered in the 
Angus Show Thursday. Bichard 
lives in Wichita Falls now.

The high school seems to be 
getting o ff to a good start. They 
have elected their sponsors or 
whatever they call it. I think I’d call 
it coercion. Anyway the high school 
sponsors are: Mias Springer-
Seniors; Miss Birkey-Juniors; Mr. 
Collins-Sophomores; Mr. Hill- 
Freshmen; Mr. Messer-7th, 8th.

Witt Builders are working on the 
Gym floor. They are refinishing it 
and repairing the dead spots (what­
ever that is). Mr. Holland said they 
hoped to be able to use the gym by 
next week.

The cafeteria serves breakfast to 
the students who wish to eat and 
serves the noon meal to almost all 
the students and teachers.

HEDLEY SCHOOL MENU 
September 13-19

Thursday-Chicken fried steak, 
baked potatoes, sliced carrots, hot

INSURANCE CAW BE AFFORDABLE
YOU MAY BE ELIGIBLE FOR A BETTER PRICE OR BROADER 
COVERAGE THAN YOU ARE GETTING.

CALL US TODAY AND COMPARE YOUR POLICY COVERAGE AND 
PRICE WITH OURS.

WE STRIVE FOR QUICK, EFFICIENT, FRIENDLY SERVICE -  AT THE 
LOWEST POSSIBLE PRICE.

15 %  Discount on Autos 35% Discount on Homeowners

Sheila Aron 
Area Director

JOIN THE ASTOUNDING 
WEIGHT WATCHERS 

^ ^ K O G R A M !

THOUSANDS OF PEOPLE ABE LOSING WEIGHT 
FASTXI THAN EVEN...AND SO CAN YOU!!
LOSE W EIG H T 20% FASTER 
IN TH E FIRST 2 WEEKS!!

Now you can discover the wonders of 
QU ICK START™ that make* losing weight 
fatter and easier than ever before. And vou can 
do it at a price that may never be offered again 

If you ever considered joining Weight 
Watchers ... there's never been a better time 
than right NOW!!

Meeting F e e ........ *7.00
Registration F ee . .*13.00 

TOTAL *20.00 
YOU PAY ONLY.. .  * 7.00

TOU SAVE *13.00
MEETING SCHEDULE;

C L A R E N D O N  
LIONS CLUB
4th and Sulley
Mon. 6:30 pm

CALL WEIGHT WATCHERS NOW!
<*•>«*«*vS w w **M  m*
M M  M  N.«  W) WW W 
nto a *  rwnsng nw*w> orfy The oW  cam* b»

r s t f s s s s : . p s t — 1 *8 0 0 *6 9 2 4 3 2 9
Stone August ft Co 19*4

am., Sept. 13, 19*4
roll*, butter, pear halves, milk. 
Friday-Chili dog*, grated cheese, 
French Fries, apple cobbler, milk. 
Meuday-Barbequed franks, hash 
brown potatoes, green salad, rolls, 
butter, pineapple pudding, milk. 
Tuesday-Fried fish with tarter 
**uce, blackeyed peat, cornbread, 
butter, mixed fruit, milk.
W * dun  day-Meat loaf, scalloped 
potatoes, green beans, roll*, butter, 
peaches, milk.

The Hedley Lioness Club held its 
first meeting of the year Thursday. 
September 6th in the Lion’s Den. 
President Zora Stephens called the 
meeting to order and plans for the 
Cotton Festival were discussed. 
The Club Float will take part in the 
Memphis Parade on September 
15th. The Club will have their 
annual Chili Supper on October 
12th starting at S:00 p.m. in the 
Lioness Hall. The Lioness Hall is in 
the old post office building on Main 
Street. After the meeting was 
closed everyone enjoyed s delicious 
supper. There were 16 members 
and 3 guests present. Those 
attending were: Zora Stephens-
President, Eva Canada-Secretary, 
Helen Lamberson-Treasurer, Mary 
Ruth White, Nora Hopper, Dottie 
Bogue, Pauline Kaufman, Sue 
Weatherly, Mildred Lett, Betty 
Williams, Patty Springer, Mahdene 
Debord, Mary Kay Gubb, Jean 
Taylor, Dorotha Crawford, Betty 
Gilchrest and visitors Rosa Day, 
Tiny Harmony, and Miss Robin 
Springer. Tiny joined the club.

Wilson Stephens recently retired 
from working for the county. T. 
Mullins took his place. I ’ ll expect 
my road to be kept bump-free now. 
Actually, the roads are kept in very 
good condition considering the dry 
weather we’ve had, so 1’U expect T. 
to keep up the good work.

Mrs. Beaulah Hall was rushed to 
Hall County Hospital Saturday. 
The doctors are running tests now.

Mollie Dickson had visiting in her 
home last weekend, Mrs. Opal 
Thomas o f Amarillo and Johnny and 
Eunice Dickson and their girls from 
Panhandle.

When I passed the Methodist 
Church this morning. Froggy 
Stewart was there working. He’s 
working on the basement and
kitchen.

Mrs. Mabel Bridges is in North 
west Texas Hospital, room 560. 
Hopefully she’ll be able to go home 
soon.

The Senior Citizens are selling 
tickets on a beautiful quilt to be 
given away at the Cotton Festival. 
You can see the quilt at the Senior 
Citizen’s Center. The tickets are 
SI.00 each or 6 for $5.00.

Come join the Senior Gtizens for 
games each Monday and Friday. 
HEDLEY SENIOR CTTIZEN MENU 

Sept— her 13-19
Thursday-Steak with gravy, but­
tered potatoes, summer squash, 
sliced tomatoes, roll, butter, apricot 
cobbler, milk, tea, coffee, juice. 
Friday-Baked ham, great northern 
beans, mixed vegetables, lime Jello 
with pineapple and cottage cheese, 
corn muffin, butter, applesauce 
with gingerbread, milk, tea, coffee, 
juice.
Maaday-Fried chicken, English 
peas, potatoes AuGratin, apple- 
cabbage-carrot salad, roll, butter, 
milk, tea. coffee, juice. 
Tuesday-Roast beef with grsvy. 
mashed potatoes, asparagus, raw 
vegetable salad, roll, butter, p^ach 
cobbler, milk, tea, coffee, juice. 
Wednesday-Ground beef with 
noodles, steamed cabbage, but­
tered carrots, pickled beets and 
onions, corn muffin, butter, straw­
berry shortcake, milk, tea, coffee, 
juice. ________

E M S  A c t i v i t y  
R e p o r t

09-06-84 Billy Price, 24 o f Garen- 
don from Prices Truck Stop, Garen- 
don to Gilkey Ginic, Garendon 
then to Amarillo Emergency Re­
ceiving Center, Amarillo. Trauma.

09-06-84 Tom Barnett, 45 of 
Lincoln, Nebraska from Prices 
Truck Stop, Garendon to Gilkey 
Ginic, Garendon. Trauma.

09-08-84 Chris O’Neal, 12 of 
Garendon from Garendon Com­
munity Center to Gilkey Ginic, 
Garendon. Medical.

09-09-84 Abe Cole, 74 of Garen­
don from residence to Hall County 
Hospital, Memphis. Medical.

232 responses handled in 1984 to

date.
Donations received: Mr. and

Mrs. Paul Bivens in memory of Ola 
Killough, Tom and Julia Murphy in 
memory of Ola Killough. Margaret 
Kidd Naylor and Mary E. Kidd in 
memory of Ferral A. Floyd.

Jew s o f l i fe  D onations
Mr. and Mrs. G.W. Faust in 

memory of Ferral A. Floyd.

New Cars

1984 Buick by Omie J. Adamson, 
Hedley.

1984 Buick by Russell Cantrell, 
Amarillo.

1985 Buick by Ruth A. Nichols. 
Amarillo.

1984 Olds by Mrs. C.M. Powell, 
McLean.

1984 Cadillac by Jimmy Keel, 
Pam pa.

1984 Buick by J .B .. WaddUl, 
Memphis.

1984 Buick by Louise Johnson, 
McLean.

1984 Buick by Bernard Wieck, 
Amarillo.

1984 Buick by Gerald Britten, 
Panhandle. i

1984 GMC PU by William S. 
Wilson, Canadian.

1984 Buick by Barbara Cook, 
Amarillo.

When tea was first intro­
duced in the American col­
onies, many housewives 
served the tea leaves with 
sugar or syrup after throw­
ing away the water in which 
they had been boiled

We are looking forward to doing business with you

Your JM m rnm - Dealer

1 W H I T E S
FIED AN D  SEED

Randy White, Manage! 874-3371

TH A N K  YO U
FOR MAKING OUR Grand Opening n success. 
We would liku to congratulate the following 
winners of 100 lbs off feed.

Keenan Shields Jake LaGrone F. A. Munden Joseph Pafume 
Ted Shaller David McAnear Elvis White Jewel Judd Doil Douthit 

Terry Askew of Guthrie, Texas Winner of the tank was Loretta Crump

A special Thank You to J & W Lumber Co. for donating the stock tank.

G E T  M O R E  T H A N  Y O U R  N I C K E L  S  W O R T H  

ALL SUM M ER  M ER CHAN DISE M U S T G O .

ALL M ENS W EAR 

REDUCED 33  V3% to 50 %

THE NOOK
Cash O nly No L a ya w a vs

5 / all ladies
AAik WEAR
‘Jm %- reduced



Greg Frank
Wootten 
celebrates 1st
birthday

0**g  Wootten turned one year 
old September 12. He enjoyed a 
birthday party with family and 
friend*.

He i* the son o f Buddy and 
Regina Wootten.

Op?
Dog Obedience

Class

by JANET RISLEY
Monday. September 10, the Don­

ley County 4-H K-9 Korp met and 
began regular class once again. 
Many old members came back to 
continue training their dog. Those 
present were Jenifer Davis with 
Ben (half Border Collie, half Blue 
Healer;, Steven Davis with Taffy 
(Toy Poodle), Gwyn Tolbert with 
Brandy (half Springer Spaniel, half 
Golden Retriever), Georgi Klatten- 
hoff with Roscoe (Miniature 
Schnauzer), Mike Moore with 
Baron Maxwwell Von Schamann CD 
(Doberman), and Janet Risley with 
Sir Laddie Boy DI (Collie).

We also had some extremely 
eager beginners participate. These 
being Scott Myers with Ginger 
(Sheltie), Matt Drager with Miky 
(half German Shepard, half Laba- 
dor), Todd McAnear with Sandy 
(mixed breed), and Sam Goodall 
with Brandy (Doberman).

We would like to thank our new 
members for participating and also 
encourage all newcomers to join. 
It’s not too late to begin.

We would also like to thank the 
parents of Jenifer and Steven Davis 
for hosting a very nice swim and 
hamburger party for all the state 
dog show participants. It was very 
generous o f them and also a great 
success.

Our next class will be held in the 
Clarendon Community Center on 
Monday, September 17, at 7:00 
p.m. If you haven’t joined yet, 
come on out and share our fun.

Judd family 
gathers for
annual reunion

John and Willene, Snooks and 
Jewel Judd were hosts to eleven 
children o f the late Mr. and Mrs.
I. T. Judd famUy at the Clarendon 
Community building Saturday and 
Sunday September 1 and 2.

Visiting, taking pictures and 
showing movies were enjoyed by 
everyone.

Those attending were Mrs. 
Berdie (Judd) Francis, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Bowerman with J.T. 
and Billy o f Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dick Judd of Wellington and Mr. 
and Mrs. Truman Judd and Angie 
of Amarillo. Mr. and Mrs. Dan 
Culp o f Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. 
Buck Judd and Mr. and Mrs. 
Dwight McKay and Jody, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bryan Owens all o f Amarillo, 
Steve Judd o f Austin, Mr. and Mrs. 
C.C. Wisdom and Mr. and Mrs. 
Alek Louhas with Marloina and 
Kent, Deana Griffin and Leesa. Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Melvyn with Jason 
and Jeromey all o f Amarillo, Mr. 
and MRs. BUI Miller o f Lubbock, 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Filter o f Austin 
and Mr. and Mrs. Billy Walker 
with Lindy, Lacy and Kyle o f Buda.
J. R. and Janell Standifer and 
Renee, Kay. Cara, Brandi Blevins, 
Vicki, Kristi and Kelly Feuerbarn 
all of Yukon, Oklahoma, Imogene 
(Judd) Johnson with Kelly, Shan da. 
and Amber King, all of Amarillo, 
Dewey and Betty (Judd) Lindey and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jeff Linley and Kelley 
all of Amarillo.

Friends attending were T.C. 
Raper o f Dumas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronald Jacobs of Amarillo, Stacy 
Quesenberry o f Clarendon, Mrs. 
Cloe Louhas and Mrs. Cristal 
Bishop o f Amarillo.

Vicki and Bob Feuerborn of 
Yukon had recently lost their home 
to fire. The family gave them a 
money love offering and also 
showered them with gifts.

The hosts and their families were 
John and Willene Judd with Eddy. 
Linda and children, Trina, Shane 
and Kyle of Clarendon, Snooks and 
Jewel Judd, Mr. and Mrs. Herman 
.Judd and Nicole of Amarillo.

The 1985 Judd FamUy Reunion 
wUI be in Clarendon over the Labor 
Day weekend.

The population of the Am er­
ican colonies in 1610 was 
350

« •  Omnmdm  Press, Thurs., Sept. 13, 1984

'Big Red Feed helps kick off 11U 
fooioall season

79408.
To obtain tickets from the Texas 

Tech Athletic Ticket Office by maU, 
send s check to: Athletic Ticket
Office, P.O. Box 4199, Texas Tech 
University, Lubbock, Texas 79409, 
or stop by the office in the north end 
of Jones Stadium southwest of the 
intersection of 4th Street and Uni­
versity Avenue in Lubbock.

Colorado Blue Spruce, Ked 
Maple. White Flowering Dogwood, 
Black Walnut, Norway Spruce, Red 
Oak, Washington Hawthorn, Euro­
pean Mountainash, Pin Oak, and 
Silver Maple trees will be given to 
members joining during Septem­
ber.

These trees are part o f the 
Foundation’s efforts to foster tree 
planting throughout America. 
They were selected because they 
provide a wide range of benefits: 
flowers, berries and nuts, as weU as 
•hade and beautiful foliage, accord­
ing to John Rose now, the Founda­
tion’s executive director. The trees 
are guaranteed to grow, or they will 
be replaced free of charge.

The National Arbor Day Founda­
tion, a nonprofit organization, is 
working to improve the qualify of 
life throughout the country by 
encouraging tree planting. The

six-to-twehre inch trees will be 
shipped postpaid at the right time 
for planting this fall between Oc­
tober 15 aad December 10. Pleat­
ing instructions will be enclosed. 
The Foundation will give the tea 
free trees to members contributing 
810 during September.

To become a member o f the 
Foundation and to receive the free 
trees, a 810 membership contribu­
tion should be seat to TEN TREES, 
National Arbor Day Foundation. 
100 Arbor Avenue, Nebraska City, 
NE 68410, by September 30. 1984.

The Red Raider Club, Texas Tech 
University’s athletic booster or­
ganization will sponsor a “ Big Red 
Feed’ ’ proceeding the Texas Tech 
vs. University o f Texas at Arlington 
football game in Jones Stadium in 
Lubbock on September 15, 1984.

The “ Big Red Feed”  is designed 
to provide quality entertainment 
and food for the entire family while 
raising money for the Tech athletic 
scholarship fund. The pre-game 
festivities will be held in the 
Lubbock Municipal Coliseum ad­
jacent to Jones Stadium from 
4:30-6:30 p.m.

The internationally famous 
Odessa Chuck Wagon Gang will 
provide the “ feed”  portion o f the 
day’s program--* complete barbe- 
que meal, prepared as only the 
Chuck Wagon Gang can.

The Pepper Martin Band from 
Odessa will provide musical enter­
tainment at the Coliseum from 4-5 
and 5:30-6:30 p.m. In between, the 
Lubbock Square Dance Association 
will provide dancing and musical 
entertainment from 5-5:30 p.m.

The Tech-UT Arlington game will 
kick-off at 7 p.m.

Tickets for the “ Big Red Feed”  
are priced at M  per meal and may 
be obtained from the Red Raider 
Gub office in Lubbock or the Texas 
Tech Athletic Ticket Office. They 
will also be available at the Colise­
um door on September 15th.

To order tickets from the Red 
Raider Gub through the mail, send 
a check to: The Red Raider Gub, 
P.O. Box 456, Lubbock, Texas

Free trees given 
by Foundation
The National Arbor Day Founda­

tion is giving ten free trees to 
people who become Foundation 
members during September, 1984.

The famous violin maker. 
Stradiverius. whose prod­
ucts now sell for thousands 
of dollars, sold them origi­
nally in the early 1700s for 
what would be lass than 810 
today.

GREG FRANK WOOTTEN

IT 'S A FACT!

One of America's most 
beautiful cities-San Fran­
cisco—was essentially ignored 
for more than 200 years. For 
tuguese explorer Juan Cabrilln 
discovered the Farallon Is­
lands in 1542 but did not spy 
the nearby narrow entrance to 
the Golden Gate. In 1769. 
Spanish explorers were the 
first white men to see San 
Francisco Bay.

Lions Nall - Clarendon 5 - 7130 p

Our Drive In Window 
Free Delivery

HDR Revlon

Shampoo
115tablets

Efferdent
40 Tablets

Poly-Vi-Sol
Circus Shapes 

100 Tablets

V n *  SMAVT

Old Spice
Aftershave

Insulin Syringe

Hall’s
Cough Drops 

30  Tablets
Doxidan
30 TabletsSpeed stick

Anti-Perspirant . 
^  2.25 oz

Premiere Perm

■UMONITTI aad PAUL BIVINS
Tw« ■•atstarad Pharmacists Ta Ssrvs Ya<

extra strength

efferdent

Gillette.

1 wg VION

1' emuenc ~ UOUDW "■AAJmc 1 MFCHAM

1f •----c.’a.s. *» — mss - w
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JR. VARSITY 
9/6 Groom
9/13 Floydada
9/20 Shamrock
9/27 Wellington
10/4 White Deer
10/11 Memphis
10/10 Ouanah
10/25 Shamrock
11/1 Wellington
11/8 White Deer

7:30 
7:30 
7 30 
7 30 
7 30

BBONCHO FOOTBALL CAFTA1NS 
[L-B) Bodney Smith, Lynn Alder 
•on, Staaley 
Known.

H 7 30 
H 730 
A 7:30 
A 7:30 
H 7:30

1 Canadian 
Floydada 
Fritck
Bays Ranch 

S Childrnta

( 6 )  ( 2 8 )  

(  )  (  )  

(  )  (  )  

(  )  (  )  

C )  ( )

8 p.m.

James F. Hayes A Ce. 
Kidds Texace

Cable TV
The Grocery Store

Ald<

Cornell Tire Center

ik Shell

Chamber off Commerce

Clarendon Auto Supply Harlan's Flowers' Mikes Gibson Pharmacy

Dry Goods Ce. Gibsons Meat Market

McKinney Meter Ce. Reynolds Machine A Supply Clarks Restaurant

Greenbelt Water Authority Bailey Bstes A Sen Choe's Package Store

Floyd's Shop Halls Tax A Bookkeeping Service 
Marys Country Kitchen Clarendon Manufacturing ; 
Osburn Furniture A Appliances, Inc. Rattan TV 

Henson's Floyd's Automotive Supply A Muffler Shop 
 ̂ Pauline Morris Bookkeeping A Tax Service

CltamMain

A *
T

Oct. 12 Memphis 
Oct. 19 Ouanah 
Oct. 24 Shamrock 
Nov. 2 Wellington 
Nov. t  White Door

Johnson's Gasis 
J A W  Lumber

IGA Foodliner

West Texas Gas

Wallace Monument

® N 0 R P P
I Insurance Agency, Jnc.

WB SUPPORT THE
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School

M e n u

r 17-21
Iqy-Roast pork with gravy, cole 
hot tofl and cheeae wedge, 

i. honey with bet-

paas, carrot stick, straw-

•Ham and cheese toll, 
con , Preach fries, JeOo 

with fruit, milk.
0  Pie with cheese. 

Style beans, tossed salad,

Mdagr-Hot dog on bon with cheese 
and chili, Preach Pries, tossed 
salad, peach cobbler, milk.

Only about three percent 
o f the earth's water is 
freeh. About three fourths 
o f the freeh water is frozer 
in

Quesenberry returns from Mary Kay 

training in Dallas
Loyette Quesenberry of Claren- headquarters o f Mary hay Coe- 

don just returned from an action- metier, lac. in Dallas, Texas, 
pecked week o f education, training Ms. Quesenberry was recently 
and motivation at the intemationaJ appointed director-in-qualification

A L M ORRAH 
SHRINE CLUB

o f  Clarendon wish to

yon

city and coonty 

givon os to holp
►

w W o | I I T O H g

lopte 18th wo havo

Joiy

at Lions Clob Building.

holpod in any way at 

is invltod

i i e i i inn be aaa Anne an ana an a. iJkA J

MARTIN BAPTIST CHURCH

7idip.m.

U N H ID  FU TBCO BTAL

CLARENDON LUTHERAN 
MISSION

INFORMATION

874-MT7

CHURCH OF JESUS CHRIST OP 
LATTER D AT SAINTS 

C a l Ends Drunk at 874-3104.

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
3rd A  Hawley 

874-2321

•74-3833

7i38p.m. FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH

i*i  We

7iM | 874-3218

PRRSRI 1ER1AN  CHURCH

7t38p.m.

ST. M ARK BAPTIST CHURCH 
iRM m tkidali

M S  a m  
lliOd a-m. 
8(30 pm ,
7.30 pm ,

______________  8.00 pm ,

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

5th R  Jeffenee 
874-3007

Wm. H. [ M l  Watson
Sunday Schaai 9.45 am .

___a n r  *-•— 1 1 JM -  _

13,

and traveled to Dallas for a week of 
extensive training to prepare her for 
the position of independent tales
Reactor.

Her trairung m Dellas featured 
executive conferences with ranking 
members of the Mary Kay manage 
merit team including president 
Richard Rogers, as well as meetings 
with top sales directors and national 
sales directors in the company's 
196,000-member sales force. Ms. 
Quesenberry was given tours of 
both the manufacturing and cor­
porate facilities and speat an after­
noon in the home of company 
founder and board chairmen, Mary 
Kay Ash.

Mb. Quesenberry now begins a 
three-month qualification period. 
After meeting all required per­
formance standards, she will be 
eligible for the appointment to sales 
director December 1.

Mary Kay Cosmetics, Inc. is an 
international manufacturer and dis­
tributor of a premium line of skin, 
body and hair care products, 
toiletries, cosmetics and frag­
rances. Net tales for 1983 were 
$323.8 million.

Sept. 29 Museum Day in 
Carson County

.O.C.1 4th A Psr
1848 a.m. Dr. E.L. Mauuhig T Peetsi
1148s a Sunday Schoei 1848 non.

Mernteg Warship 
Yeutfc Program

1148 a.m. 
848 p.m.

848p.m. fv iu fogW areh fo 748 p.m.

B T BBdeStudy 2i38 p.m.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
5th f t ]  

■egerGcky.l

7.34 pm .

, M A R T S  c a t h o l ic  c h u r c h
IA  Montgomery 

Rev. J. ArswM Carfeeu
9t38em.

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
Hwy 287 A  Jsikssn 

874-3479
Geey L. PkMsn, PuoWr 

Sunday Scheel 18mm.
Sunday Warship 11.88 a m
■ M s  Study 808 pm .
Evsufog Warship 748 p m

708 p m

ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST 
EPISCOPAL CHURCH 

iny Seheel M 5 i
11481

If a baked cake sticks to the 
pan. try placing the pan on 
a cloth wrung out in hot 
water. It may help remove 
the cake from the pen

Saturday, September 29, will 
mart the nineteenth anniversary of 
the Carson County Square House 
Museum Dsy and the twenty-sixth 
annual Pioneer Dey.

Special programs and art exhibits 
are planned throughout the day 
culminating with the barbecue at 
the Carson County Agriculture 
Building. The Museum Day activi­
ties begin with class reunions in the 
morning, and art exhibits beginning 
at 9 a.m. The featured artist this 
year ia David Damm, of Irvine, 
California. David it an outstanding 
western artist who will be bringing 
his work to the Square House for 
the first time. An exhibit of 
Chilmark Pewter sculptures, cour­
tesy o f Wagner’s Jewelers o f Ama­
rillo will be on display in Freedom 
Hall as well. A  gallery lecture on 
the production o f pewter will be 
given at 10:30 a.m.

At 10 a.m. a branding party will 
be held following the peat tradition. 
Area cattlemen are invited to bring 
their brand, a sketch of the brand 
and brief history, and with the hot 
fire furnished by the arrangements 
committee, put their brand on 
beams at the museum. Mr. Jim 
Williams will be in charge o f the 
branding party.

The Museum Day program, 
featuringT. Boone Pickens, Jr., will 
commence at 2 p.m. at the High 
School Auditorium. The Panhandle

High School Band will provide the 
music, and as in the past, the Bones 
Hooks memorial will be presented 
in honor of area pioneers.

At 4 p.m. e  Blackpowder Fire­
arms Demonstration will be held at 
the museum. Mr. John C. Adams, 
11, a former resident of Panhandle 
and now of Okarche, Oklahoma, will 
give a demonstration with arms of 
his own manufacture.

From 4:30 to 7:30 p.m., the 
annual barbecue will be served at 
the Carton County Agriculture 
Building. A  country store will also 
be in operation.

The public is invited to attend. 
All activities, except the barbeque 
which required a $5 minimum 
donation to the museum, are free to 
the public

The word ye, in such expres­
sions as 'Ye Olde Shoppe." 
is pronounced like the word 
the The letter y in Anglo- 
Saxon indicated the same th 
sound as apparent in the 
current spelling

353-9133 
3710 Olson

Under New Management 
Shirley Cason 

Owner/Manager

FULL SERVICE SALON

Newly
Remodeled... 

Relax and enjoy 
our lovely 

new
surroundings! Reg. $14.

N O W  $7.

“Pilot
Good Thru Saet 

Ask For
Stsphani* Anderson
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FOB SALE

C a l aa, wa aaad1tettegs #74-2533. 
SANDERS U A L  ESTATE 

7M S. McClaflaad
#74-2533

CABLE TV
“ Ttora'a m n  to m «  «  C r ib  T V ."

J,3‘ 4’ 5’ • * 7* *• *•» 13- Cal#74-2322.

STEVE’ S AUTOMOTIVE *  
INDUSTUAL ENGINES

•74-3444

LOYD'S B A C K H O E I

DITCHING SEEV1CE
Install septic tanks and Install and 
repair all kinds o f water lines.

>874-2287
10-27tp

Ledge 7 *  AT/AM  
S ta te d  M e e t in g ,

Iam b i

DONNA’S ALL B IEED  

DOG GEOOMING 

244-3441 GROOM, TEXAS
49-TFC

LAM PS,LAM P PARTS, 
allgbtbMba

HOUSE OFSHADES

L A M P E E P A II 
Weiflto V Siege

, Tea. 74149

M A C K  W AND CARPET 
CLEANING CO. 

Sbaeel971
Professional steam cleaners. W e do 
commercial and residential. W e are 
licensed Scotch-Guard applicators. 
For a free estimate call 874-2019.

38-ltc

See our bin election of La Z Boy 
recltner* and other name brand 
home fumlrhtngs auch aa BroyhiJI, 
BaaaetG Maateroraft and <nhera 

GABLE FURNITURE 
7th A Brice Street 
Memphis, Teiaa

32-TFC

IT S  HEBEI
NOW

t h e  n e w  Knurr
“ HEBTrAGED”

Far a "n s  sb lgstlsn " dsi 
Ian  m l  McVlebar Kirby 
[804] 874-3443 anyttae. FBI 
GUI and Chance to wto a 

iR .
VCtfr

FOB SALE* 3 bedroom bouse, base­
ment, large kitchen, and dining area, 
utility room, 100 ft. front, good 
location. This house can be seen at 
416 South 4th (the Mrs. D.T. Small­
wood home). 874-2485 or 874-3649.

18-tfc
FOB SALEi 3 bedroom house on 64- 
acres, 4 large out buildings/barns, 
stock pens, 4 acres cultivation/new 
fence, large garden plot/orchard, new 
well, new septic tank, VS mile east of 
Clarendon. Call 874-3829 or 874-3354.

18TFC

FOB BALE 0 1  LEASE TO SELL in
Wellington donut shop on square, 
all equipment and supplies, good 
business, must sell due to ill health. 
806-447-5712.

36-4tc

JIROM I CUSTOM 
USNOLSTMY
AvthOMOtivi 

■B id  N ov iih o li

•roe Isthaatat 
•74-3854

Jom  Ferrer, the renowned 
actor, showed such skill 
at music during his school 
days that it was felt he 
would someday be a con­
cert pianist

MARY 
KAY  

lOSMITICS
L iy it t i  

Q i i s u b i r r y  
874-2495

Kay M abry  
874-2859

FOB SALEi Rye seed, 
sacked. Henry Hastey, 874-2117.

38-4tp

FOB SALEi El bon rye, cleaned and 
bagged, $12.00 per 100. Delbert 
White 806-856-2481.

38-2tc
FOB SALEi 1977 Bluer. Call 
867-3421 after 6 p.m.

38-2tp
TAKING ORDERS for tomatoes and 
okra. 874-2064. THE TBAILWAYS BUS 

wN be

C a l year leenl t

Garage
Sale

FOE SALEi Rye aeed, cleaned and
sacked. 874-2220.

38-1 to

GARAGE SALEi refrigerator, 
dinette, mens and women* cloth­
ing, lota o f miac. 22 miles west of

Rentals

STATION
19-23.

38-2tp

1-888-442-4443 
to ! free

2 8 "

COMMERCIAL PEINT1NU

Clarendon on Highway 287.
38-ltp

OARAGE SALE. September 15, 
from 9:00 A.M . to 6:00 P.M. at 623 
E. Third, South Calvary Baptist 
Church. Tent, cots, Ashing rings, 
sleeping bags, adult clothing’ 
jewelry, linens, and much more.

_ _____

Real Estate
f t

CLARENDON OFFICE 
SUPPLY 4  PU NTING  

Mr. 4  M is. G.W. Estfack
1874-2843 

, TX 74224

worn SALI
BYO W NIR

FOE SALEi Lot 8268 Nocona HUls. 
Call 405-928-3031 after 4 p.m.

38-3tn

FOE RENTi Newly redecorated
furnished apartments, conveniently 
located. Just perfect for the first 
starting out married couple or 
single adults. $160.00 and $175.00 
plus $50.00 deposit, water paid. 
Call 874-3493.

38-ltc

FOB SALEi 88 acres, good farm, 
excellent land, on pavement, near 
Hedley, all in cultivation. #56-3061.

38-4tc
HOME FOB SALEi Ideal location, 
near school, 4 bedroom, roof and 
carpet only 2 years old, ceiling fans, 
priced to sell $27,500.00. Contct 
Johnny Gemer 874-3294 or 874- 
3597.

38-2tr

APARTMENT FOB RENT. Nice 
two bedroom loft, furnished, new 
carpet, paint, panelling, air con­
ditioned. No children. No pets. 
$165.00 montly plus electricity and 
% tout gas bill. Water paid. $50.00 
deposit, 874-3379. If no answer call 
874-2602.

36-ltc

ROOMY FURNISHED sOctowry h r  
n o t. $125.00 plus %  total gas bill. 
$35.00 deposit, no children, no 
pets, water and electricity paid. 
874-3379.

38-ltc

o bedroom un- 
Also three bed- 
house. Phone

THANK YOU
We want to thank all our friends 

for your kindness after the death of 
our loved one, Agnes O. Boliver.

Your food, flowers and visits, and 
cemetery donations were very much 
appreciated.

The Family o f Agnes O. Boliver 
38-ltp

38-2W

W ANT TO DO HOUSE CLEANING 
in Hedley and surrounding areas. 
Phone 856-3891.

37-2tp

FOB RENT, tu
furnished house, 
room furnished 
874-3818.

38-ltp

Employment

PART-TIME I N  0 1  LVN

WE NOW HAVE 
tog u rb to g  at J4W  1

34- tfc

CUSTOM H AT CUTTING AND 
BALING and custom farming. 
Contact Larry Watson 874-2178.

35- 6tp

LICENSED CHILD CARE. Call 
Nancy New house, 874-2118.

APPLIANCE
SIRVICI
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,1X79226 

874-3801
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Owner’s Exdaatve Ag— ti

Carol Nlatoa
874-3449 er 874-3148
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Coraoll Raal Istata
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"A ll real works of art look 
at if they were done in ioy."

— Robert Henri

C al 884-747-3223.
23tic

874-3554 er

OFFICE SUPPLY
Bookkeeping supplies, storage boxes, 
office machine ribbons, office furn­
iture. Clarendon Office Supply and 
Printing, G. W. Estlack, Claendon, 
Tex 79226

GOOD INVESTMENT
Very pretty 3 bedroom, 2 bath home 
on 7 acres. Also welding and machine 
shop located in Lelia Lake. Call Palo 
Duro Realtors for further details 
358-8141.

28tfc

BARGAIN
2 bedroom stucco home on 2 lots In 
Hedley, ownty will carry with low 
down payment. Call Palo Duro 
Realtors in Amarillo, 358-8141.

7ft.HU

447-5668 «  447-5447 
Cal aayttow day ar aigh

SIRVICI
★  S e p tic  T a n k s

★  D ir t  H a u lin g
★  D itc h e s

★  G r o u n d  T a n k s  
Traa Roamval

■leky Rattan 
•74-2522 

Tax Naylor, 
•74-2541 -
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RANK YOU Claroadaa aad all off 
Doaloy Cooaty ffor supporting 

lo rdoa 'o
aad thol r fflao Dairy Rrodacts 

BILLII AND DANNY DUNN , , 

Claroadaa

BUY

Brown-McMurtry Implement
D u n n e  l A C J i D I i lP H O N E  8 0 6 42 3 -2 4 4 1

BOX 777
SILVERTON. TEXAS 79257 

DON BROWN 
Home Ph. 823-2292

SALES 
SERVICE

CLARENCE W A 
Home Ph. 823-2083

B A i u r n m  a n d  s o n

Welding Pabr leaf lag
Bams

Custom Portable Buildings 
Enameled Steel Buildings

TERMITE PR

5 CECIL & ALICE MUNDEN
J  are now operating at 
*

Hills Petroleum on 287 

East (Old Fina Station) 

We have regular, un­

le a d e d  and diesel at 
J  competitive prices
3 come to see us
^  *

3 4 a  N. B. 23rd 
AasarOa, Texan 79187 

State lie . Na. 117$I CaBact 383-7875 State Lie. Ne. 117$

LEO RUSSELL S &

All
Kinds off Grain

Clarondon Grail 
■lovators, Inc.

J.R. Gill
F. O. Bax 805

i,  Tax 79224 
874-3172

ALLEM ESTLACK
Electrical and Appliance Repaii 

Call 874-3663 Box 596
Raadad A  Llcoasod

MORROW'S RIDl-MIX
★  Roady M ixo d  Coocroto ★  Rackhoo
★  Storai Collars ★  Cash aa Dallvary

ALL TY R IR  CD M CR ITI W ORK
■ARL M DRRDW  - D W N IR  874-2571

LaGrone 
Monument Co.

$ 7 6 - 8 0 1 1

'Bwltlfn Mcnioniih"

M il E 27th 
Anuirillo. Touts WKM

JANII MILL 

8 7 4 - 2 4 7 3
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At htola Martin 
Naws

Mr. and Mrt. B a n d  Hawley of 
Texas and Mrs. Otto 

Padgett o f Amarillo spent Saturday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mr*. Do** 
Finley.

Vera and Orville Bayes o f Lub­
bock visited with the Doyce 
Grahams and with other relatives In 
this area this week.

Nancy Miller o f Amarillo glad­
dened the day for Lily Knox when 
•he visited her after attending the 
Ashtoia Reunion.

The Jerry Green family and the 
Bill Talley family o f Hedley were In 
Memphis at the Haakell Talley 
home to enjoy barbeque Sunday. 
The children, Jerry, Chrisie. Josh 
and Matt attended a Care Bear 
Birthday Party for Dustin’s first 
birthday. Dustin is the son o f Vid 
and Anthony Knowles.

Monday afternoon Mort and 
Danny Sain o f Wellington stopped 
for a roadside discussion with 
cousins Mary and Jerry Green and 
children while they were working 
out some kinks in their seed truck.

Thu and Kent Mills brought 
Heather to see her great grand­
parents, the L.A. Watsons, Sunday. 
They live at Vernon.

Tuesday morning Naomi Green 
and Ellen and Stephanie Patterson 
visited with Pa Green and Quackle 
and WacMe at Canyon.

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Holland 
took Brock to the fair at Amarillo 
Sunday. tt was Brock’s first

experience and he enjoyed it very 
much. Danny and Kathy reported 
that it waa an unusually fair fair.

Gifford and Stella Jewett went 
with Willy and Irene Bosch of 
Lubbock for several days fishing at 
Baylor Lake. They returned and 
spent some time canning out of 
Stella's garden.

Jonna Naylor o f Amarillo visited 
with the H.A. Greens, the Jerry 
Greens, and Ellen, Tiffany and 
Stephanie Patterson Saturday after­
noon. She was headed toward 
Thalia for Duane Naylor dan 
gathering. W e hear that 1.30 
inches o f rain on Thursday wet 
down the dove and the cotton.

Stella Jewett was in Memphis 
Thursday to see her sisters, 
Beatrice Edwards and Tommie Sue 
Odom and her daughter. Windy.

Benny and Ruth Clay are enjoy­
ing a visit from Wayne, Nancy and 
Michael Gay o f American Falls, 
Idaho. Their daughter, Mary Ann 

Hickman o f Breckenridge is also 
here. Bernice and Bertha Porter of 
Borger came Tuesday to visit with 
the family.

This red-faced reporter did not 
check out information and although 
it was reported that Boyce Hall 
came home from the hospital last 
week and it was this week before he 
arrived. He says his bed feels 
awfully good.

Melba Risley entered the Hall 
County Hospital last Friday for 
treatment o f her hip and back 
condition.

Eunice Land gave Pete an 80th 
birthday dinner on the 19th of 
August. All of the Land family 
attended. A belated Happy Birth­
day to Pete.

Visitors in the J.R. Brandon
1 ) M « « f
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mini-Jumbo
CERTIFICATES

$50,000 minimum deposit $25,000 minimum deposit

12.50 % 12.25 %

1

2 Year

12.625
365 Day

12.50
180 Day

2.25

%

%

%
90 Day

2 Year

12.375
365 Day

12.25
180 Day

1 2  %

90 Day

%

°/«

Tbtal Assets $706,000,000 
Tbtal Net Worth $38,000,000

All accounts insured to $100,000.00 by FSLIC. 
Substantial penalty for early withdrawal 

Rates subject to change.

VERNON
SAVINGS & LOAN

' "" MEMBER FSLIC

119 Soulh 6th Street Memphis. TV 79245 |806| 259-33*4 

HOME OFFICE 
Vernon, Ttatas 

OTHER OFFICES
Dallas IX.. Childress TV. Memphis TV. Paducah TV. Frederick Ok
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The

home last Thursday were W.D. 
Brandon, Jimmy Lee and Don 
Matherson o f Clande and their 
visiting daughter and family from 
Wichita. Kansas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruce Gorwoski and Ramy and Mr. 
and Mrs. T.M. Cole and Mrs. 
Murel Brown of Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. J.R. Brandon 
attended the Top o f Texas Trailer 
Rally at Boys Ranch during Labor 
Day weekend. They enjoyed the 
rodeo, barbeque and Sunday morn­
ing chapel.

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Spivey were 
in Amarillo Sunday to see Oleta and 
David Lane show their sheep at the
fair.

Brodus Spivey o f Austin came by 
to see his parents, the Claude 
Spiveys, this week enroute to 
Pam pa for business.

LaRue Pitman o f Amarillo spent 
Labor Day with her parents, the 
Tom Shadles.

Monday night Gary and Marcia 
Davis entertained with their annual 
first night Cowboy Fan game night. 
Skeet and Gary barbequed chickens 
and about 16 guests enjoyed food 
and the Cowboy victory.

Lori McDaniels o f Port Worth 
came this week to visit her sister, 
Eunice Land. They all attended the f 
Golden Wedding Anniversary of 
Way land and Florine Fitzgerald at 
Sil vert on Sunday.

Karby Garvin, daughter o f Paula 
and Lane Garvin, celebrated her 
first birthday Sunday at their home 
in Silverton. Guests were the
grandparents.

Guests of Doyce Graham Tuesday 
and Wednesday were Robert and 
Elizabeth Graham o f Plain view and 
Mamie and James Gark o f Lub­
bock.

Mr. and Mrs.

U , 19B4

Paul G one from 
Wash, visited Mr. and 

J.R. Brandon and W.D. 
Brandon this weekend.

Duane and Mae Naylor o f Thalia 
were among other Naylors to enjoy 
the annual picnic at the T.E. Naylor 
creek at Hedley. They came 
Sunday evening to visit with Mr. 
and Mrs. H.A. Green.

=

Ho ward wick Nows
By ALICE HOOD

Cabbage Patch slumber party. She 
ikfHf f f von friends Attend to p ity pin 
the pigtails oa the Cabh _ 
doll, asuaical chairs and other

hot

The Lakers

Patch tt*~- w-,;th vacatioa.

Trudy Davis ha* been in the 
hospital. She had a reaction from 
the medication she takes for 
diabetes.

Gene Rowe of Memphis, (unde of 
Alice Hood), is beck in VA Hospital 
in critical condition. A  tumor was 
removed from his thout and is 
malignant.

L.C. Keith is improving very well 
from a heart attack, August 31. 
He was taken from Gilkey Clinic to 
Hall County Hospital, then to 
Northwest Tezas Hospital In Ama­
rillo. He is o ff the critical fist, in a 
private room, 546. He waa up and 
about Monday, visiting with two 
sisters, a niece and friends. Wish­
ing everyone a speedy recovery.

Margaret Pettit and Madelyn 
Jones met with the G ty  Commis­
sion Monday to see if  they could get 
a County Extension Agent to re­
place Cherri Brown. Cherri married 
this past spring and moved to 
Amarillo.

Haley Hamilton recently cele­
brated her 7th birthday with a

dogs, Kool Aid and 
doll cuke. Haley 
beautifal gifta. Her 
a n t  and unde, daddy, 
several cousins attended for a < 
to join is the fun.

Penny Butts had a few days l 
from work and she and Al and i 
friends went fishing and boating. 
A l’ s mother came by to vteit them.

Becky and Dan Coil and sons. 
Daniel and Timothy o f Dallas (Alice 
Hoods daughter) spent the Labor 
Day weekend with family sad 
friends here and in Amarillo. They 
are preparing to move to Houston.

Barry and Beverly Hudson have 
moved into Charles Boren’s new 
bouse on Franklyn Drive. They are 
expecting the arrival o f twins 
anytime the doctor informed them.

Th# nation's first Labor Day 
was observed in 1869. It  be­
came s national 1*^1 holi­
day in 1894.

"Truth it rarely pure and 
never simple." Oscar Wilde

"He who has clear ideas can 
command." Goatha

According to folklore, you 
can expect rain if ad ant 
covers the hole to hit anthill.

•pF-any'’ ' 8 -

i
? »

THANK YOU
W e
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Ice Crprdes
THURS. SEPT. 39 thru SUN. SEPT. 23 

AMARILLO d V IC  CENTER

TICKETS 

ON SALE i- 
NOW!

FARMERS
OKOCBIY A m a r k it !

Kaye & John Murphy

TW.M.... 7.SSPSS
Urn . M M t 4 » " l

CLARENDON

STP AIR FILTERS
A clean air filter can save 
gas
Satisfaction guaranteed 
Can restore lost engine 
power
STP . . the name you can 
trust in car-care products

( No.697 Excluded)

$3«7
OIL TREATMENT
Fights motor oil breakdown 
Gives your oil muscle 
Adds an anti-wear, anti­
oxidant agent for an extra 
measure of protection 
The first time you need oil, 
and every time you change 
oil, add STP oil treatment

15 Ox

STP DIESEL FUEL 
TREATMENT
Keeps injectors cleer 
Disperses water 
Fights fuel line freeze 
and contains no alcohol 
STP . . .  the name you can 
trust In car-care products

8 Ox

STP DOUBLE OIL FILTER
Filter-in-a-fllter protection 
Combines long life and high filtering 
efficiencies
STP. . .  the name you can trustjn car- 
care products

STP CARBURETOR SPRAY CLEANER
Removes gum, sludge, and varnish
Cleans carburetors, linkage, automatic 
chokes and PCV Valves 
Spray it on -  watch it work!
STP the name you can trust in car-care 
Droduct^

13 Ox

QASTREATMENT 
Saves gas 
Cleans carburetors 
Removes water 
Fights gas-line freeze

12 Ox

$|37

_J i

STP SON OF A GUN!" 
PROTECTOR
The shine means protection 
Protects vinyl, rubber, leather 
plastic
Screens harmful ultraviolet 
rays
Brings out the color 
Satisfaction guaranteed

8 Ox° Q

STP FOAMING ENGINE D E G R E ASE R
I Deep penetrating foam dissolves 
I dirt, grease and grime 
I Spray it on -  watch it work -  hose 
l i t  off
[Fast-cleaning foam -  leaves no
|dily film
|STP the name you can trust in 

;ar care prodn.,>:

16 Ox

STP SINGLE OIL FILTERS
Designed to meet rigid performance 
specifications
Full-flow filter ▼
Satisfaction guaranteed
STP . . .  the name you can trust in car- 
care products

STP MOTOR OIL -  10W-40
Meets and exceeds all new-car war 
ranty requirements
STP 10W<i!/ Motor Oil is “SF" rated 
Highest API gasoline engine oil 
rating
STP.. the name you can trust in 
car-care products Motor 0*

QT



Senior
Citizens News

The cantaloupes were enjoyed at 
lunch Tuesday were furnished by 
Dennis sad Ruth Lindky. They 
picked them, brought them in and 
we enjoyed them. Thanks a lot, we 
appreciate you good people.

Dennis and Ruth Lindley also 
treated the Dance Gub to a 
watermelon feed after dance prac­
tice, Monday night August 27th. 
W e really enjoyed some good eating 
out on the lawn in the moonlight.

Birthday/Anniversary Salad 
Supper. August 28, 1984 •• Gets 
bigger and better all the time. 
Sisty of us enjoyed a table full of 
good food, a lot o f visitation, music 
and games. We were pleased to 
hsve Billy Rsy snd Janice Johnston 
as our guests snd hope they will 
visit us agsin. Thanks Billy Ray for 
playing the Happy Birthday song. 
It's grest that we had four couples 
present with August anniversaries. 
They were: Truett and Thelma
Behrens. Blaine and Murle Butts, 
Frank and Gertrude Reid and 
Earnest and Verdie Tipton. Birth- 
day people attending were: Eunice 
Mann. Garence Carman, Gifford 
Taylor, Lela Swain, Helen Welch, 
Lillian Eudy, Frank Reid and Dene 
Davidson. The door prize went to 
Goldie Barbee and caps to Raymond 
and Nora Hopper, Alta Adkins and 
Louise Argo. Music makers were:

~ Creed Smith, Dee Williams, Fred 
Fortenberry, Al Lawson and Ray 
Anderson. It was nice having Al

join our music group. We do 
appreciate these people for enter­
taining us.

Thanks to C.A. Pitts, Ray Ander­
son, Creed Smith, Pst McCombs, 
Jim Groom, snd all others that have 
brought us fresh tomatoes.

A  big THANKS to Janice Breit­
ling and the Quivira Girl Scout 
Council for several boxes o f Girl 
Scout cookies. I sm sure we will 
enjoy esting these.

Calendar M Events 
September 13-19

Thwreday-Exercise 11 a.m., Exer­
cise 2 p.m.. Game Night 6-10 p.m. 
Friday -Exercise 11 a.m. 
Mondsy-Blood Pressure 9 s.m.-l 
p.m.. Exercise 11 s.m., Exercise 2 
p.m.. Dance Practice 7-9 p.m. 

Tuesday-Exercise 11 a.m.. Arts and 
Crafts 1 p.m., Dance-Community 
Building 8-11 p.m. 
Wedneaday-Hearing aid test and 
service 10 a.m.-12 noon, Exercise 
11 a.m., Exercise 2 p.m.

Senior CMseas Menu 
September 13-19

Thursday-Pinto beans with ham, 
spinach, tossed salad, cake and 
peaches, cornbread, milk, tea, 
coffee.
Friday-Breaded fish, asparagus, 
cream corn, coleslaw, apple pie, 
hushpuppies, milk, tea, coffee. 
Meoday-Liver and onions, mashed 
potatoes, brussel sprouts, sliced 
tomatoes on lettuce, fruit and 
cookies, dinner rolls, milk, tes, 
coffee.
Tueeday-Salisbury steak on rice, 
green lima beans, carrots, pine- 
apple/cottage cheese, plain cake 
with lemon sauce, dinner rolls, 
milk, tea, coffee.
Wednesday-Fish sticks, whole

The Clersndeu Frias,

potatoes, green beans, coieslaw, 
cherry cobbler, cornbread, milk, 
tea, coffee.

Veterans enrolling 

under Gl Bill

According to Jack A. Moicman, 
Veterans Service Officer for Donley 
County, persons planning to enroll 
in school under Veterans Ad­
ministration programs this coming 
fall should commence work on their 
applications without any further 
delays.

Veterans planning to enroll under 
the GI Bill, as well as wives, widows 
and children of certain veterans, 
should make certain that the neces­
sary paper work has been ac­
complished.

Gl Bill training for veterans 
terminates at the end o f ten years 
following discharge or release from 
service. Wives and children of 
100% service-connected disabled 
veterans, as well as widows and 
children of veterans whose deaths 
were caused by service-connected 
disabilities, are eligible for educa­
tion and training under VA laws. 
This latter group o f beneficiaries 
have an entitlement period of ten 
years from the date eligibility is 
determined, generally the date of 
death of the veteran.

Veterans may enter training 
under the OI Bill without any VA 
counseling, although the special 
counseling is available upon re­
quest. Wives, widows and children 
are not required to undergo coun­
seling if they are pursuing a college 
degree program. Otherwise, coun-

, Sept. 13, 1984

seling may be required before VA 
benefits can be paid.

GI Bill veterans who are full time 
students may receive VA benefits of 
S342 per month, plus allowances for 
legally established dependents. 
Wives, widows and children under 
the Va Dependents’ Educational

Assistance Program are entitled to 
$342 per month if enrolled full time. 
There is no additional allowance for 
dependents o f wives, widows or 
children.

Page 12

For assistance in applying for VA 
benefits, visit your local Veterans 
Service Officer or visit the school 
you wish to attend.

Back in 1829, New England rum was considered to be 
excellent for cleaning the hair and keeping it healthy. 
Brandy was supposed to strengthen the roots.

R C / l^ v ,
We bought a bunch at bargain prices and 
were passing the savings directly on to you' 
Brand new top-quality RCA color TVs many 
in original factory cartons . some one-of-a- 
kmd all with RCA s limited warranty Choose 
from portables, table models and consoles— 
including remote control But you've got to 
come in soon to take advantage of these once- 
in-a-blue-moon deals because once they re 
gone, they're gone1

TW O  Y E A R S  FREE SERVICE ON

FU R N ITU R E & 
A P P LIA N C E S , INC.

PifklM
Dole 46 O i Can '

Pineapple Juice 9 8

Carceal
BriquetsSUGAR

ftonor 21.5 Ox Bottle A  ^

Downy > |

Tewels

k\\ p u rp o s e

Wrights Sliced SlabCountry Frida USDA Grade “ A ”

Beef v a i  
Liver

Oscar Mayor Family Pack 1 Lb Fkg

Bologna 5 f  5


