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Greenbelt Lake depth  u

i t t r e e  city w om en 
n o m in a te d  (o r 
D istinguished  Service 
A w ard

of nurses at die 17-bed Adair 
Hospital. She secured state 
accreditation at the hospital 
where there was only one 
other registered nurse and 
graduated two classes of 
vocational nurses. A tornado 
in 1970 brought more than 70 
injured persons to the hos­
pital where Thomas super­
vised the transfer and care of 
the victims. For her work, 
she was commended by the 
Texas governor, the Disaster 
Section of Texas Medical 
Area and the National Gvil 
Defense. Since the hospital 
closed in 1970, she has 
remained as a nurse for Dr. 
Richard Gilkey, at the Clar­
endon Medical Center and 
the convalescent home where 
she is on call and does not 
charge for her services. She 
and her family are active in 
the Fust Baptist Church of 
Garendon and the four sons 
of Gaude and On its Thomas 
all have earned Eagle Scout 
awards.

The Xi Lambda Xi chapter 
of Beta Sigma Phi Sorority 
has chosen to nominate Betty 
Veach.

Veach teaches business 
education courses in Garen­
don schools in addition to 
serving as area advisor for 
Future Teachers of America 
and advisor to the school 
yearbook staff. One of her 
students has been elected to  
area FT A offices for the pest 
four years under her direc­
tion. Community activities 
include 1926 Book Gub, Beta 
Sigma Phi, Rebekah Lodge, 
and the First Baptist Church. 
She is a member of Texas 
State Teachers Association, 
National Education Associa­
tion and Texas Business 
Education Association. She 
also has volunteered as an 
Explorer post advisor.

Ten recipients will be 
chosetl from 98 nominees in 
professional and career 
fields, civic service and 
education in the 32-county 
Texas Panhandle.

The “ All For the Family” 
awards luncheon, which be­
gins at 11 a.m. in the WTSU 
East Dining Hall, will feature 
Dr. Emily Taylor, director of 
the Office of Women in 
Higher Education of the 
American Council on Educa­
tion in Washington, D.C.

Tickets to the luncheon are 
$7 each and must be reser­
ved or obtained from the 
WTSU Office of Programs for 
Women by Friday, April 17.

Garendon’s nominees are 
Diane Chamberlain, Onita 
Thomas and Betty Veach.

Diane Chamberlain is the 
nominee of the Mu Gamma 
Chapter of Beta Sigma Phi 
Sorority.

She is president of Beta 
Sigma Phi, president of the 
Art Gub, president of the 
Women’s Golf Association 
and a member of the Presby­
terian Church, Country Gub 
Board, chairperson of the 
library board and a leader 
with 4-H and Girl Scouts. She 
is married to Trey Chamber- 
lain.

Onita Thomas has been 
nominated by the Pathfinder 
Gub, 1926 Book Gub and 
Les Beaux Art Gub.

A native of Donley County, 
Thomas is a registered 
nurse, wife, mother and 
physician 's assistan t. In 
1964, she became supervisor

} Mitch Johnson will repre­
sent Donley County at the 
Regional Spelling Bee in 
Amarillo on April 25. The 
thirteen year old son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Owen Johnson. 
Mitch is an eighth grade 
student at Garendon Junior 
High School. He will com­
pete with forty-three other 
County Champions for the 
right to represent this region 
at the National Spelling Bee 
in Washington. D.C., in 
June.

Besides spelling, Mitch 
enjoys bike riding, skate 
boarding, and golfing. He 
also played football on the 
eighth grade team, and he is 
a member of the high school 
band.

Sheri Chamberlain was 
named the Junior Donley 
County Spelling Champion in 
the Junior Bee. She is the 
twelve year old daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Will Chamber- 
lain. She will also attend the 
Regional Spelling Bee where 
she will be presented a 
Junior Champion’s Spelling 
Trophy.

Sheri is a sixth grader who 
enjoys roller skating, riding

Girl Scout Ice 
Cream Social

An Ice Cream, Cake and 
games outing is planned for 
Tuesday, April 28th at 6:00 
p.m. at the park. All Girl 
Scouts and Brownies are 
inviting their families, lead­
ers and all persons connected 
with Girl Scouting or the 
Quivira Council in Garendon 
to attend. Eachfamily is re­
quested to bring a freezer of 
ice cream or a cake.

Jane Kadingo, field dir­
ector of the Quivira Council 
willy inform the girls about 
Day Camp and Resident 
Camp and hand out the 
Camp Books, as registration 
is coming up soon.

In case of rain, the outing 
will be held at the Lions Gub 
Hall.

Spring music 
program w ill 

honor Kenny
Students from the 6th, 7th 

and 8th grades are presen­
ting a Music Program in 
Honor of Kenny King, April 
24 at 2:30 p.m. in the High 
School auditorium. Some of 
the songs to be sung will be 
“ The Tide Is High,” "An- 
other One Bites the Dust,” 
"King of the Road” , and 
“ On the Road Again” .

Hill, Sheri Chamberlain, Tim 
Cox. Patty Terry, Kristi 
Deen, Nikki Robinson, 
Rodora Gray, Joseph Jara- 
millo. Jay Gage, Charles 
Slavin, Jon Couch, and Scott 
Edwards.

The Amarillo Globe-News 
sponsors these spelling bees.

horses, swimming, working 
on latch hook rugs and riding
bicycles.

Others spelling in the 
Senior Bee were Jes Ash­
craft, Sheri Chamberlain, 
Roy White, Blade Barker. 
LelancT Howell, Michelle 
Fricks, Denicee Richardson, 
Eilene Mincey, Brett Har- 
bert, J.W. Shields, Brent 
Hayworth, Doug Hawkins, 
Randy Crump, Lee Smith. 
Robert Youngblood, Tara- 
lena Cole, Missy Johnston, 
Stan Garland, Annette Wat­
son, Susan Mosley, Russell

Scout banquet 
to be held 
Friday

Boy Scouts of lroop No. 
433 will hold their annual 
Scout Banquet Friday, April 
24 at 7 p.m. at the First 
Christian Church.

At this time the Troop will 
present its 38th Eagle Scout, 
Carlton W. Cox. A court of 
honor for other scouts to 
receive award will be held.

Speaker for the occasion 
will be Mr. Mark R. Kinsey, 
District Scout hx.

Parents and friends of 
Scouting in Garendon are 
invited to attend, the cost is 
$5.00 per plate and it will be 
catered by the Branding Iron 
of Memphis. Please contact 
Mr. Saye or Gene Alderson 
to obtain tickets. If possible 
please let us know by Thurs­
day by 5 p.m.

Alexander, and Toni Mich 
els.

Participating in the Junior 
Bee were Pam Harguess. 
Stephanie Graham. Debbie 
Terry, Stephen Ecklund,

_T»na Copelin, Kyndle Lon-
gan, Trish Gifford. Linda

LVNA s will hold 
respiratory seminar

MTTCH JOHNSON SHERI CHAMBERLAIN

Work day Saturday for 
little league field

To start the coming Little 
League baseball season off, a 
work day at the Little League 
field has been planned for 
Saturday, April 25, at 10 
a.m.

There will also be work­
outs for the kids ages 10-13 
who are interested. All par­
ents and other interested and 
involved adults are urged to 
be present for planning the 
aritivity of the Little League 
this year.

The date to keep in mind—
Saturday, April 25. 10 a.m.

City wishes to 
thank 
Brownies

Inc., in June 1980. The 
company leases Durable 
Medical Equipment through 
Medicare/Medicaid with the 
physicians authorization. 
Equipment available is listed 
for those attending the semi­
nar.

Ms. Betts, is very well 
qualified for her work as the 
following will demonstrate. 
She is a University of Hous­
ton Graduate Nurse, receiv­
ed Respiratory Therapy 
Training at Baylor Univer­
sity, Houston and was Surgi­
cal Supervisor at Jefferson 
Davis Hospital, Houston. 
She went from Surgery to 
Respiratory at the same hos­
pital.

She also has been Respira­
tory Therapy Director at De 
Lar and Citizens Hospitals in 
Victoria; Driscal Childrens 
Hospital in Corpus Christi 
and most recently at Wilbar­
ger General Hospital in Ver­
non.

The public is invited to this 
most important and informa­
tive seminar.

LVNA, Greenbelt Division 
will host a Respiratory Semi­
nar, May 2, 1981, beginning 
at 1:30 p.m. at the Farmers 
State Bank Hospitality 
Room. There will be a fee of 
$5 for everyone attending, 
except Student Vocational 
Nurses in this area.

This seminar will be of 
particular interest to those 
persons who have Emphy­
sema and chronic lung ail­
ments in all age groups.

Guest speakers for the 
seminar include Mike Butts, 
registered pharmacist with 
Mikes Pharmacy at Gibsons 
in Garendon. Butts will dis­
cuss medications affecting 
the respiratory tract. An­
other guest speaker will be 
Glen Gist, of San Antonio. 
His talk will be in regard to 
the oxygen concentration. 
Joye Bettes, C.R.T.T., of 
Vernon will speak on the 
anatomy of the respiratory 
tract and the breathing 
machine (IPPB).

Joye joined the staff of 
Baylor Leasing Company,

Time marches ahead 

this week end
Chamber 
makes a 
thousand dollar 
g ift to the 
library

Presented by Bronnie 
McNabb, vice-president of 
the Garendon Chamber of 
Commerce a handsome gift, 
a check for $1,000, was given 
to Diane Chamberlain for the 
Gabie Betts Burton Memo­
rial Library recently.

The library board, Friends 
of the Library and the many 
persons who have worked for 
and given to the library 
appreciate the gift of $1,000 
and the support of the G ar­
endon Chamber of Com­
merce for this important 
organization.

Junior High sports

garden, plowing an extra few 
acres, keeping the kids up 
longer (until dark) and for a 
few-extra time for golf, ten­
nis and other past times.

For all of us it is a sure 
sign that winter is gone and 
summer is on the way I

It is time again for the 
‘spring ahead' into Daylight 
Savings Time and the annual 
confusion of setting clocks 
and watches ahead in pre­
paration for the next six 
months of time.

For most households the 
easiest way to make the 
change is to run all timekeep­
ing pieces ahead one hour 
before retiring Saturday 
night April 25.

The lost hour is still a bone 
of contention for those who 
are opposed to the twice 
yearly time changes. These 
persons (some of them) insist 
they suffer fatigue for six 
months until the hour is 
made up beginning the last 
Sunday in October.

For many pleasure seekers 
the extra time before dark­
ness allows, weeding the

ALL SPORTS 
BANQUET 7 p.m. 

APRIL 28, 
HIGH SCHOOL 

GYM

activity

re p o rt
4-15-81 Margie Dehr, 58 of 

Amarillo from Medical Cen­
ter Ginic, Garendon, to 
Amarillo Emergency Receiv­
ing Center, Amarillo. 
Trauma.

4-16-81 Charles Lewis, 82 
of Garendon from Medical 
Center Nursing Home, G ar­
endon to St. Anthonys Hos­
pital, Amarillo. Medical.

4-17-81 Renee Carlisle, 17 
of Garendon from Medical 
Center Ginic, Garendon to 
Amarillo Emergency Receiv­
ing Center, Amarillo. Trau­
ma.

4-17-81 Erskine Butler, 81 
of Garendon from Jodies 
R estaurant, C larendon to 
Veterans A dm inistration 
Medical Center, Amarillo. 
Medical.

4-20-81 Gladys Diggs, 26 
of Garendon from High 
Plains B aptist H ospital, 
Amarillo to Medical Center 
Nursing Home, Garendon. 
Medical.

59 responses handled la 
1981 to date.

Fifteen
week

arrests made last

bond.
Theft of jewelry reported 

in girls dorm at Garendon 
College and currently is 
under investigation.

Fifteen arrests were made 
during the past week.

Donley County Sheriff, 
Jimmy Thompson has proven 
even in this short time after 
his assum ption of the 
sheriff’s office, that his 
pledge to the residents of 
Donley County to persue the 
lawbreakers to the best of his 
ability, is being carried out. 
The Donley County Sheriff1 s 
office has arrested 30 per­
sons since April 1, alone.

For all the residents who 
subscribe to law and order, 
we say, “ You are doing a 
good job, Sheriff Thomp­
son.” '.

Arrests for the past week: 
One arrested for theft by 
worthless check. Court satis­
fied.

Three arrested for DWI. 
Two arrested for burglaries. 
Two arrested for verbal as­

sault. Four arrested in two 
separate incidents of auto 
theft, three in one incident 
and one in the other. One 
arrested  for consumption 
after hours. Two arrested for 
public drunk.

The Hedley Post Office 
was the victim of a burglary- 
theft in which $8,000 worth 
of checks were taken. Two 
persons were arrested, ar­
raigned and gave statements 
on the incident. At this time 
they are out on bond.

A pickup truck was stolen 
at Lelia Lake by three juven­
iles and recovered by the 
Gaude unit outside Wash­
burn.

Three subjects are in jail 
in Childrens. *nd one was 
jailed in Wellington, on car 
theft now out on $15,000

H ave you re n d e re d  

y o u r taxes yet?
Tax exemptions for home­

steads and for the disabled 
and the tax renditions for all 
county tax payers need to be 
made by April 30.

To receive your exemp­
tions they must be requested 
at the tax office and signed.

Wanda Smith, Donley 
County Tax assessor-collec­
tor, is reminding all Donley 
County tax payers that they 
need to render their taxes. It 
is to the property owners 
advantage to render his 
taxes, i-



B M H

•rdSeK idge, Uoyd 
~ .W . Lovelady la d

at the dty  kail on
T. April 11. l t t l  at 

• .a .  M—fcan  pnxent 
w ere Mayor W aldon E. 
M oore; A lderm en Carol 
Cole, Neal Mann. Leon May 
■no to a n ie  rn ctett; wttn 
Alderman Lawrence White­
head absent. Others present 
w en  Q ty Secretary Connie 
MBam and approximately 
twenty (20) guests.

•M eeting called to order 
and guests welcomed by 
M oon.

•Invocation lead by Pric- 
kett.

•Motion to approve min­
utes of March 14, 1961 
regular monthly meeting as 
corrected made by May and 
seconded by Prickett. Motion 
carried - 4 ayes.

•Motion to approve min­
utes of April 6, 1961 called 
meeting as read made by 
Mann and seconded by Cole. 
Motion carried - 4 ayes.

•March 1981 financial re-

•P nrchaae a t  e lection

sMp in P tP C m ads by Cole 
and seconded by Maan. Mo­
tion carried - 4 ayes.

•M otion to adopt onRa-
ance granting a rate schedule
to Greeabeh Electric made 
by Mann and seconded by 
May. Motion carried - 4 ayes.

•R esults of opinion poll 
and suggestions reviewed.

•M otion to keep swimming 
pool open whatever it takes, 
either lease it, if possible, or 
city operate it made by Cole 
and seconded by Mann. Mo­
tion carried • 4 ayes.

•Fire Department letter 
from Texas Forest Service 
read.

•Motion not to allow bingo 
to be held in city hall on 
election nights made by May 
and seconded by Prickett. 
Motion carried - 3 ayes and 1 
abstention ( Mann).

•Status quo of flag pole for 
city hall reported.

hi using for sewer <*i>f <* BIB Hodges, 
Report that this is Chy Attorney Jerry C o u n ty
M i f i  m  ‘ I K tB o b

Federal All-Risk 
Crop Insurance.

Tim e  is running out!
April 30, 1981____

is the deadline for 
Contacting JEM

Act now to assure yourself 
complete crop protection j ]

*

Federal Crop InsuranceU S DeeaB’MfN’ Of AGU'Cva TuAf

Simmons
Insurance
Agency

•C om plaint o f several 
places la aped o f d saa  19 . 
Stslrm rnt far complainant to 
bring each place to attention 
of city.

•Howardwick Lions Club 
asked council to study possi­
bility of granting permission 
for them to build extension 
on city hall. Statement for 
them to bring plan and 
specifications to next city 
meeting.

•M otion to adjourn made 
by Cole and seconded by 
Prickett.

Jury gives

probated
sentence
In the trial of Willie 

Weatherton, on a burglary 
with intent to rape charge, 
held in District Court, April 
IS and 16 in Garendon the 
jury returned a verdict of 
Guilty with ten years proba­
tion.

The trial resulted after the 
incident which occurred Oc­
tober 23, 1980 in Garendon 
was reported by a Garendon 
woman and investigated by 
local authorities and the 
charge was made against the 
defendent.

Deliberation by the jury 
took one and a half hours 
before the nine man, 3 
woman jury returned the 
verdict.

B o ard  of 
A lderm en
Met

The Board of Aldermen of 
the City of Garendon met in 
regular session on April 7, 
1981, in the Board Room, 
City Hall at 7:00 p.m.

Members present were 
Mayor Shirley Gifford, Al­
dermen James Kuhn, Leon-

P ostm aster 
McCombs.

•M inutes of the March 24, 
sad April 6. meeting were 
read, and motion was made 
by Selvidge, seconded by 
Lovelady to approve sitd  
minutes. Motion carried.

•Bills incurred by the Chy 
in the month of March were 
presented. Upon a motion by 
Lovelady, seconded by 
McCord, said bills were 
ordered paid. Motion car­
ried.

•City Attorney Jerry 
Courtney read the agreement 
between the City of Claren­
don and Donley County in 
regard to combining the Po­
lice and Sheriff Depart­
ments. Attorney Courtney 
then explained each part of 
the agreement.

•Motion was made by 
Selvidge, seconded by Bell to 
sign the agreement with the 
County if the County would 
accept the balance of the 
Police budget, until October 
1982. Motion carried.

•Motion was made by Bell, 
seconded by Kuhn, to with­
draw from P.R.P.C. Motion 
carried.

•Motion was made by 
McCord, seconded by Love­
lady, to appoint Kuhn mayor 
pro tern. Motion carried.

•There being no other City 
business at this time, the 
meeting was adjourned. Mo-

CLARENDON PRESS 
and the Donley County 
Leader. Publlabed every 
Thursday at Clarendon, Tex­
as, 79226, Box 1110, at 
Hlway 287 and Jefferaon  
Street and entered aa Second 
Claaa Mall at the pout office 
at Clarendon, Texas. Helen 
Woody, Publisher and Jea- 
nke Weatfierlv. Editor, 

Subscription rates: $ 10.00 
a year outalde Donley Coun­
ty, $8.00 a year In Donley 
County.

Any erroneous reflection 
upon the character of any 
person or firm appearing In 
these columns will be gladly 
and promptly corrected upon 
being brought to the atten­
tion of the management.
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Folgei
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REGULAR DRIP ELECTRIC PERK

FOLGER’S
COFFEE 1 LB. 
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PRICES EFFECTIVE 
APRIL 23-25.1981 

WHILE SUPPLY 
LASTS!

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

"THERE'S ONE NEAR YOU"

OPEN 24 HOURS 
365 DAYS A YEAR 

WE ACCEPT 
FOOD STAMPS

1 Strawberry Early 17 ox can

PRESERVES —*■ 79« JUNE PEAS 4 / $ 100 

SHORTENING < l ,s

W arranty Deeds
Floyd R. Hood and wife, 

Alice Marie Hood, to David 
Case and wife, Saundra 
Case, all lota #181 and 182, 
Cherokee Sect. Sherwood 
Shores IX, Dooley Co.

Dona Boling, to Henry 
Merrick and wife Lucille 
Merrick all lot #67 Cherokee 
Sect. Sherwood Shores IX, 
Donley Co.

J.D. Riley and wife Shirley 
A. Riley to Billy Lee Johnson 
and wife and Billie Jo John­
son S/80’ of lots #8,9 and 10, 
Blk. #62 O.T. Garendon, 
Donley Co. Tex.

Collados Estates, Inc. to 
Donald E. Eads and wife 
Genella M. Eads, surface 
only of all lot #33, Collados 
Estates. Donley Co. Tex.

J.B. Lane to Jerry H. 
Green and wife Mary Gale 
Green 310.5 acres (more or 
less) and more fully des­
cribed on p. 292 Vol. 169, 
Deed Records.

Royce Cantrell Corpora­
tion to Roy Hunnicutt and 
wife Myrtle E. Hunnicutt all 
Itos #1, 2, 3, 4. and S/2 #5. 
all in Blk. #12 O.T. Hedley, 
Donley Co. Tex.

Charles H. Taylor and 
wife. Fern Taylor to Max 
Hennigh, lot #63 Cherokee 
Sect. Sherwood Shores IX. 
Donley Co.

Richard Leon Liner and 
wife Lorene Liner to William 
O. Daniel, Jr. and James D. 
Buckley SW/4, Sect. #37. 
Blk. 21, Abstract #77, H. & 
G. N. Ry. Co. Surver Donley 
Co. Tex.

Freddy L. Stafford, to J.B. 
Stafford an undivided Vi 
interest in and to the tract 
more fully described on ps. 
308 and 309 Vol. 169 Deed 
Records.

Security State Bank ol 
Hedley to The City of Hedlev 
all lot #17. Blk. #2 O.T. 
Hedley Donley Co. Tex.

Southland Properties, Inc. 
to Gilbert Brown and wife 
Annie Brown all lot #182 
Navajo Sect.. Sherwood 
Shores IX. Donley Co. Tex.

Cristy Jo. Bagwell to the 
Amarillo National Bank, 
trustee an undivided ‘/j sect. 
#67. Blk. #22 H. & G. N. 
Survery. Donley Co. Tex.

Glenn F. Miller and wife 
Baby Jo Miller, to The 
A m arillo N ational Bank,
trustee, sects. #66, 68, 92, 
sod 116, all in Blk. 22 H. A  
G. N. Survey and an undivi­
ded V* of Sects. 90. 93 sod  
94, all in Blk. #22 H. A O. N. 
Survey.

Southland Properties, Inc. 
to J.T. Richardson Rig and 
Construction Inc. all lot #117 
Nocona Hills, addition to 
Howardwick, Donley Co. 
Tex.

John T. Gifford to Norman 
D. Hampton and wife Lometa 
M. Hampton all lot #55 
Pueblo Sect. Sherwood 
Shores IX, Donley Co. Tex.

Lila Wiggins, Mavis Har­
grove, Jeff Wiggins, W.B. 
Wiggins, and Oran Wiggins 
to Viown Winn all lots #4, S 
and 6, Blk. #1. McDouga! 
Addition to Town of Hedley, 
Donley Co. Tex.

Charles D. Holman. Exe­
cutor, to Lee White lot #123 
Apache Sect. Sherwood 
Shores IX Donley Co. Tex.

Greenbelt, Inc. to G 1

Holman lot 9123 Apache 
Sect. Sherwood Shores IX,
DqoleyGo. Ten.

Johny L. Byrd and wife, Jo 
Ana Byrd to Forrest C. 
Washbourne and wife Floy 
P. Washbouroe. oil lot #61, 
Cherokee Sect. Sherwood 
Shares IX. Donley Co. Texas.

Dan Trew and wife Elaine 
Trew to Forrest C. Wash- 
bourne and wife. Floy P. 
Washbourne, all lot #8ll, 
Cherokee Section, Sherwood 
Shores IX, Donley Co., Tex.

Hedley

Justice of 

Peace report

March 1981 report filed by 
Justice of the Peace Precinct 
3. 54 cases filed in March, all 
by the Dept, of Public Safety, 
61 cases paid in March and 
distributed as follows: Fines 
paid to County $1,284.00. 
State Tax $152.50, Law En­
forcem ent Officers Fune 
$61.00, Total for March 
$1,497.50.

ApU » ,  7 p.m. 
Donley County Courthouse 
Annex, Donley County His­
torical Survey Commission 
meeting.

Fri., April 24, 2:30 p.m. 
H igh school Auditorium  
Spring Music Program by 
6th, 7th and 8th grades.

April 26, 4-H Play- 
day, 2 p.m. Rodeo Arena.

Fri., May 1, Garendon 
College graduation 7:30 p.m. 
Fine Arts auditorium 

M en., April 27, 7:30 p.m. 
EMS Assn, meeting at City 
Hall complex

M on., April 27, 7:00 p.m. 
Junior High All Sports Ban­
quet, High Scfcool cafeteria.

Sat., May 2, 1:30 p.m. 
Hospitality Room, Farmers 
State Bank, Respiratory 
Seminar.

Shop
Clarendon

first

FOR BETTER HEALTH
The JOG-A-LEAN can help you develop 

grace, and balance, relieve tension and relax 
nervee, tone mnedee and tissue for a 
younger look, control weight and Increase the 
body’s absorption of oxygen, vital la many 
necessary functions of the body. A healthy 
body also resists disease and Illness more 
readily than an unsound body.

JOG-A-LEAN
SPECIFICATIONS AND REQUIREMENTS

1. 38” Diameter, Weight lim it: 295 lbs.
2. All Heavy Duty Steel Frame.
3. Six 1” Round Steel Tube Legs Plated, 

with Steel Reinforced Rubber Feet
4. Cover Pad, Choice of Three

Color*! Burgundy Dark Green Brown
5. Water Proof Matt
COMES COMPLETELY ASSEMBLED

’ U S ’ * Plus Tax Prepaid 

JL * I  3 S * “ Plus Taa COD

Ix cB lItB t G uarantee

Delores Crump
311 Carhart Clarendon

874-2855

WELCOME
CLARENDON COLLEGE 

EX-STUDENTS

We are proud to

extend a cordial 
welcome to yew 
and we are glad 
to have had a 
part in helping

Clarendon College 
Grew .

F A R M E R S  S T A T E

IS'
\
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Thompson, Haley and B. J, 
Hamilton, Candl Hoggard,

WINNERS In the 4-6 year old 
Division were: Mandy Floyd,

WINNERS IN the 0-3 div­
ision were: [1 to r[[ Tonya

Destiny Bond, S tephanie names Is unknown 
Floyd and the boy on the end

Gage Jeremy Grady

Second Annual Easter 
Egg Hunt

Alpha Upsilon Epsilon 
Chapter of Beta Sigma Phi 
hosted the Second Annual 
Easter Egg Hunt, April 19, 
1981 at the Qarendon City 
Park. Approximately 100 
kids participated in the hunt. 
There were a total of 18 
dozen candy-filled eggs 
hidden, 35 prizes given 
away, and a raffle was held 
for a big stuffed Easter 
Bunny and a stuffed dog. 
There were lots of winners 
and everyone seemed to have 
a really good time. Alpha 
Upsilon Epsilon members 
stated that they plan to hide 
30 dozen eggs next year and

give away even more prizes. 
They wish to thank eveyone 
who participated in the hunt 
and also another great big 
THANKS to all of the busi­
nesses and individuals who 
donated prizes or money to 
sponsor the event. The 
members of Alpha Upsilon 
Epsilon that dedicated their 
time and efforts to the Sec­
ond Annual Hunt were: San­
dra Eads, Terri Floyd, Terry 
Floyd, Denise Grady, Pam 
Hart, Wanda Hill, Nancy 
Johnson, Jeanne Mon­
dragon, Fuzz Mooring, 
Nonie Nixon, Kathy Skinner. 
Tonya Owens and Pat White.

JEREMY GRADY WON A 
BUNNY

A lpha U psilon Epsilon en joy  social
Those present were Mr. 

and Mrs. Eddy Eads, Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny Floyd, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lynn Floyd, Mr. 
and Mrs. Chuck Hill. Nancy 
Johnson and Doug Kidd. 
Mrs. Joe Mondragon. Mr. 
and Mrs. Ricky Mooring and 
Mr. and Mrs. Walt Skinner.

silver, and if they didn’t
o rd e r  s i lv e r ............ W ell,
have you ever eaten jello 
with your fingers or a knife??
Everyone had a really good 
time and wishes to thank 
Terry and Lynn Floyd for 
having the social in their 
home and the social commit­
tee for planning it.

Have you Thanked

The members of Alpha 
Upsilon Epsilon Chapter of 
Beta Sigma Phi were guests 
at Dirtie Girtie's Restaurant 
on Saturday. April 4, 1981. 
They were served a three 
course MYSTERY DINNER 
consisting of a Cooked Actor, 
Spudniks, Cob Pipes, Satan’s 
Embryos, Female Scouts and 
Japanese Joy Juice; which 
was actually, Ham, Baked 
Potatoes, Corn on the Cob. 
Deviled Eggs, Brownies and 
Tea. The members had just 
two minutes to order from 
the mystery menu and what­
ever they ordered is just 
what they got. They had to 
even place an order for their

WINNERS IN the 7-11 Krystal Stroup, Kristi Win- Thom pson, and Johnny 
frey, Micbell DeLozier, Julie

MISTY LONGAN WON A
MJMMF* —■» y Kim McAfee Thompson

B O O KJ & W LUMBER
( 0  House Paint The new carpet has been 

put down in the library. The 
pattern looks perfect with our 
rustic style paneling and 
could have been custom 
designed for the library. Go 
by and have a peek.

When you are in the 
library, don’t forget to look at 
the selection of magazines. 
We subscribe to 19 different 
periodicals. Among these 
you will surely find some­
thing to interest you.

A hearty welcome is ex­
tended to our new patrons: 
Betty Tolbert, Nelda Jack- 
son, Kathy May, Ann Payne, 
Ginton Payne, Wynara Wat­
son, Laddi Turner, J. Scott 
Turner, Trent and Diahe 
Mooring and Christina 
George.

New books on our shelves 
include: "Brain”  by Robert 
Cook, "The Court Years” an 
autobiography by William 0. 
Douglas, "Explaining Amer­
ica” by Garry Wills, "Nice 
Girls Do” by Dr. Kassorla 
and “ Horn of Africa" by 
Philip Caputo.

The Horn of Africa—God’s 
Joke on man. A land of 
scorched desert, harsh 
mountains, piercing thorn- 
bush, brackish water. It is 
the back of beyond, the 
rugged edge where no rules 
govern.

They were an odd lot, 
Nordstrand, huge and men­
acing, capable of anything, 
Gage, burnt out from too 
much war, Moody, cashiered 
from the British Army, and 
Colfax, who conceived the 
mission. They were to 
smuggle arms into the horn 
and train a Moslem warrior 
tribe.

and admiration of men.
Some people say, “ 1 can 

worship God out in nature” 
and it is true, but how often 
do you bow down and out 
there and thank Him for what 
He has done. Church is a 
place of Thanksgiving. 
Praise and worship as we 
adore Him together.

If it has been a long time 
since you have thanked Him 
for His Providence and 
goodness to you. it would be 
easy to close up that part He 
has reserved for you. Like 
the sinner who continues to 
harden his heart against His 
call “ Will suddenly be des­
troyed and that without 
remedy” .

If you haven't thanked 
Him recently why don’t you 
do it now after He sent the 
good rain last week.

Mental Health 
Month is May

Mrs. Johnny Davis of 
Clarendon will lead Bellring­
er workers in a house-to- 
house drive during May, 
Mental Health Month.

Mrs. Davis will be calling 
on others in the community 
to assist with the organiza­
tion and working of the drive. 
All citizens are called upon to 
aid in this drive to benefit the 
fight against mental illness 
and the improved care for the 
m e n ta l ly  i l l .

Clarendon
College
graduation

Graduation exercises for 
Garendon College will be 
held on Friday, May 1, 1981 
in the Fine Arts Auditorium 
at the college at 7:30 p.m.

A reception will be held 
preceding the graduation 
and will begin at 6:30. Stu­

d e n ts  and fam ilies and 
guests are invited to enjoy 
this social hour.

By WAYNE NAYLOR
"It is a good thing to give 

thanks unto the Lord, and to 
sing praises unto Thy Name, 
O most High” Ps. 92:1

We have returned just 
after some good rains, from 
Central Texas and in many of 
those places along the way 
the furrows were full of 
water. At great expense and 
the irrigation farmer does the 
same as he readies his land 
for the Spring planting. As 
we drove along God had 
provided the same thing for 
the fields of farmer after 
farmer from His superb sup­
ply.

One farmer was told after 
he had fought johnson grass 
and other noxious growth out 
of a piece of land that he 
ought to thank God for such a 
pretty field. He answered, 
"you ought to have seen if 
when the Lord had it by 
Himself." But he should 
have realized that until he 
started to using with his 
curse of, “ the sweat of 
brow" the devil had it under 
the curse of the land. For the 
First Book of the Bible says 
that the earth would bring 
forth thornes and thistles and 
by the sweat of his brow 
would man eat. So if the man 
watered it from his own 
underground water, he still 
must thank God for putting 
the water down there and 
giving him the ability to get it 
and have the means to get it. 
So, even the man who had 
done much and many have 
still must thank God for His 
part in their success.

Art amazes me and I can 
look at good art in lots of 
places, but I have not seen 
anyone paint the kind of 
pictures in the spring as God 
does as He mixes His flowers 
in a profusion of colors. The 
bluebonnets by the acre 
mixed with other flowers of 
different colors are evidences 
that God has a good paint­
brush and uses a masters 
stroke to get the attention

Eddy Finley

Finley receives 
Dr. of 
Philosophy 
Degree

Eddy Finley, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jess Finley of 
Alanreed, will receive the 
Doctor of Philosophy Degree 
during the May 9, 1981 
Spring Commencement at 
design and evaluation 
classes as well as specializa­
tion in computer programs 
designed for agricultural 
research.
Oklahoma State University, 
Stillwater. Finley majored in 
Agricultural Education and 
minored in Educational Ad­
ministration, and will gradu­
ate with a GPA of 3.86. 
While at OSU, he was a 
member of the following 
honorary fraternities: Omi- 
cron Delta Kappa, Alpha Tau 
Alpha, and Phi Delta Kappa. 
Also, he served as Graduate 
Student Senator. O ther 
responsibilities at OSU in­
cluded conducting and teach­
ing graduate level research

Glidden B ES T Latex 
Gloss House Paint
• Chalk resistant, glossy finish
• Quick drying, easy to use
• Easy water clean-up

Glidden B ES T  Latex 
Flat House Paint
• Quick drying, durable flat finish
• Resists blisters, peeling, cracking
• Easy water clean-up

"Horn of Africa” is a 
novel that probes the outer 
limits of conscience even as it 
tells a superbly gripping tale. 
It Exposes the dark side of 
human nature-the side that, 
freed of all restraints, acts 
without pity, without con­
science, and without re­
morse.

Glidden

EXTER IOR -BEST QUALITY

A C R Y L I C  l AT E X

house
paint



President Morton gnvo t  
(•port o f rick members, 4th 
of July Bar-B-Q ticket sales 
snd A1 Morrah Shrine Club’s 
blood drive collected 35 pints 
of blood for the blood drive.

mortality rate in this sees 
86% and fatal heart attacks
70%. Everyone needs to 
know what these young men, 
assisted by their direct com­
munication network to Ama­
rillo doctors, can do in ren­
dering medical aid in an 
accident, heart attack, burns, 
drug overdose, poisons and 
other medical emergencies.

To appropriately end the 
program Katherine Green 
sang "His Eye on the Spar­
row" accompanied by Dee 
Williams.

Every dub or organization 
should have these dedicated 
young men on their program, 
so everyone can be familiar 
with this important commu­
nity medical service. Thev 
are averaging 16 calls per 
month in Donley County.

Mr. and M rs. A .0 . 
Youngblood are 
the engsgem ent of their 
daughter Card Adrianne to 
Weldon Wayne KeUsv. The 
couple is planning an August 
22nd wedding in the First 
Baptist Church.

The future bridegroom is 
rite son of Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
D. Kelley of Amarillo.

President. Noble C.L. Mor­
ton, presided snd recognized 
visitors, Fred Russell, Pst 
Robertson, Phillip Vargas, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bernie Green 
and Dee Williams.

Vice President, Noble A.R. 
Henson introduced the pro­
gram, presenting Para Med­
ics Pat Robertson and Phillip 
Vargas. They gave a history 
of Emergency Medical Ser­
vice (EMS), demonstrated 
and explained their emer­
gency medical equipment.

Since the establishment of 
Panhandle Emergency Med­
ical Service with 66 active 
trained para medics, they 
have gained recognition as 
the No. 1 in the nation. These

Plant Clinic 

slated
A come and go garden and 

ornamental plant clinic will 
be held Tuesday, April 28 at 
the Lions Hall in Clarendon 
from 10:00 to 11:45 a.m . Dr. 
Roland Roberts garden and 
harticulture specialist and 
Dr. Robert Berry, disease 
specialist, with the Texas 
Agriculture Extension Ser­
vice will be available to 
answer questions. Everyone 
is invited.

Miss Youngblood is a I960' 
graduate of Clarendon High 
School and attends Claren­
don College.

Her fiance is a 1979 grad­
uate of Dalhart High School 
and will receive an Associate 
Degree in Business Admini­
stration May 1st from Gar-

Breeze through this fun 
season in our cool, easy 
care sportswear. C or­
duroy short has half elastic 
waist for neat fit. In bright 
action colors. Sizes 3-15. 
Sleevless polo is poly/cot­
ton jersey knit in pastel or 
bright stripe. Both sport 
our seagull logo. Sizes 

, S-M-L.endon College
CAKUL ADRIANNE 
YOUNGBLOOD Starla Mann, 

Charles Michael 
plan nuptials

Mr. and M rs. M ilton 
Mann of Clarendon are an­
nouncing the engagement of 
their daughter, Starla Dawn, 
to Charles D. Michael, Jr.

The prospective bride­
groom is the son of Dr. and 
Mrs. Charles D. Michael of 
Wellington.

A May 23 wedding date 
has been set.

M iss Mann graduated  
from Clarendon High School 
and is a freshman at Claren­
don College.

Her fiance graduated from 
Sidney High School, Sidney, 
Neb. and will graduate from 
Garendon College in May.

, SHORT 

! SHIRT
By GENE ALDERSON

The Garendon Lions Gub 
held its regular meeting at 
noon on Tuesday at the Lions 
Hall. Twenty-two Lions, Lion 
Sweetheart Viola Graham, 
and four guests were pre­
sent. Johnny Floyd, with 
Eddie Floyd's Shop, was the 
guest of Lion Allen Estlack. 
Athlyn Estlack was a guest of 
the club, and Lion Max 
Hennigh was a visitor from 
the Howardwick Club.

Following the regular 
opening ceremonies. Boss 
Lion Davidson introduced 
Lynn Cherry, District Gover­
nor of our own District 2T-I. 
The District Governor in his 
opening remarks mentioned 
that two new clubs had been 
chartered in our district this 
year and twenty new clubs 
had been chartered in the 
state. He also urged any local 
Lions who could to attend the 
District Convention in Ama­
rillo this weekend. The main 
speaker will be W.R. (Dick) 
Bryan from Doylestown, 
Ohio, who is a Past President 
of Lions Intemtional.

District Governor Cherry 
then announced that his 
main reason for visiting out 
club today was to bestow a 
very great honor on one of 
our members. At that time 
he presented Lion Homer 
Estlack with the “ Key of 
Nations” . This key recog­
nizes Lions who have spon­
sored 100 new members. Out 
of 1,300,000 Lions, Lion Est­
lack is the 152nd to receive 
this award. Following the 
presentation. Lion Estlack 
received a standing ovation 
from the members and 
guests. Congratulations, 
Lion Estlack!

Countrified, Chicken-fried!
The Dude. Golden chicken-fried 
meat with crisp lettuce and red, ripe 
tomato, all done up fancy on a 
toasted bun.
Drop in fo r  The Dude!
At an inflation fightin' price!

^SCIENCE LIVESA pril 2 0  thru 
A pril 2 *  o n ly '

M o n d a y
c s m d f lY

USDA
W ilson’s C ertified Thick Sliced SHORT RIBS

Giever

HOT LINKS

USDA
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FRANKS

t CHEESE 1  
AVOCADOS 2 /2 8

LEMONS 2
Valencia

ORANGES
16 ox bog .

CARROTS 2h 
BELL PEPPERS

WHITE ONIONS 
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BAR B OUE SAUCE 7 3
lo o s  Kraft CotaUna-Low Cal. or Reg. 1000 Island
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B ract Team 
: to Cu KHm  oa Thun- 

April 16th and came 
with another trophy. 

Of courae this trophy repre­
sented the sw eetest victory 
of the year since it read: 

"Ustrict 2-AA Boys Track 
Champions 1961. This is the 
fourth consecutive year that 
die Bronchos have captured 
the team title. It is the fifth 
meet out of seven that the 
Bronchos have won this year. 
The Bronchos scored 160 
points to win the m eet. 
Wellington was runner-up 
with 152 while the other team  
to ta ls were as follow s: 
W heeler 127, Memphis 57, 
Shamrock 15, Canadian 13.

The Bronchos proved once 
again that team champion­
ships require the efforts of all 
members of the squad. The 
Bronchos combined several 
winning efforts with points 
from 2nd through 6th places 
to secure the championship. 
It was truly a team effort as 
depth in all events and the 
never-say-die attitude of the 
Bronchos once again proved 
what we've known all along. 
THE BRONCHOS ARE 
CHAMPIONS.

Bronchos who partici­
pated in the meet and scored 
points are as follows:

SHOT PUT
Brad McGuire 2nd, 47’5 i/ j ” , 
Arlis Thomas 6th, 42’7V4” 

DISCUS
Brad McGuire 3rd, 131’5” . 
Blake Bryant 4th, 125’4", 
Brian Hill 6th, 119T '. 

LONG JUMP
Alton Gaines 1st, 21 '4 ‘/«” , 
Lance Thornberry 6th, 
19’6y«”

HIGH JUMP
Alton Gaines 1st, 6', Lance 
Thornberry, 2nd, 6’

POLE VAULT
Alton Gaines, 1st, 13’6” New 
School Record, Ted Sawyer 
4th, i r ,  Glen Weatherton 
6th, 10'

Craig Shields. David Weath­
erton, Randy W hite. Bobby 
Weatherton 2nd. 45.5

3288 METER BUN
Shaun Heil, 2nd, 11:10.6

110 METER HIGH 
HURDLES

Lance Thornberry 3rd, 15.1, 
Drew Thornberry 4th, 16.1, 
Keenan Shields 5th. 16.28

800 METER DASH
Craig Shields 1st. 2:09.34. 
Brian Rogers 6th, 2:14.59

100 METER DASH
Bobby W eatherton 2nd,
11.14, David W eatherton
5th, 11.37

400 METER DASH
Glen Weatherton 3rd, 54.90, 
Randy White 5th, 55.47

300 METER INTER. 
HURDLES

Lance Thornberry 4th, 42.26, 
Keenan Shields 5th, 42.30, 
Drew Thornberry 6th, 42.64

200 METER DASH
Bobby W eatherton 2nd,
23.14, David W eatherton 
5th, 23.78, Glen Weatherton 
6th, 24.45

1600 METER RUN
Shaun Heil 5th, 5:20.28 

1600 METER RELAY
Drew Thornberry, Keenan 
Shields, Randy White, Craig 
Shields 3:42.31, 3rd 

Other members of the 
team who participated were 
Terry Noble, Ronnie Perry, 
Mark Dickerson, Chuck 
Brogdon, and Brad Thomp­
son.

All Bronchos who finished 
either first or second in their 
event qualified for the re­
gional meet in Odessa on 
May 1 and 2. The Bronchos 
are searching for a regional 
qualifiers meet to run in this 
week as a tune up for the 
Odessa meet.

E p iK O H ia n ‘
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Do they ready “go to acfai

As much as anything else, 
the Confirmation (or Inquir­
ers’) Classes are for the 
"joinee’s” own protection..
. .  so that he knows exactly 
what he’s getting into. This 
simple, interesting set of 
instructions from the mini­
ster assures complete under­
standing of the church’s 
tenets. Attendance at these 
classes carries no obligation 
to become a member.

Episcopalians don't dis­
count the sudden revelation 
of God’s presence. They do, 
however, believe that a more 
deliberate initiation into 
church membership may be 
less likely to wear thin in 
subsequent years. ____

less likely to wear thin

before joing the church?

They have some pretty 
good reasons for believing 
the Christian faith involves 
both the heart and the head. 
They don’t mind being 
joshed abut their ‘‘thinking- 
man's religion.” Christ, they 
say, dem anded simple 
faith—but not blind faith.

If these articles have 
struck your imagination and 
you think you might be 
interested. Please contact 
the Vicar at 874-2231. He will 
be starting an inquirers class 
April 28, 7:00 p.m. at the 
Mission Hall of St. John the 
Baptist Episcopal Church, 
3rd and Park St. No down- 
payment required.

TH E

' I I U C  1 M
I 40 at Grand •  Amarillo, Texas

presents

$36* <i
GREAT

GETAWAY
At this low N  v  PLAN /  price, the
entire family n . can enioy the
Best Western *■----- Villa Inn's spe
cial getaway plan Included is: A luxurious guest 
room •  Complimentary champagne upon arrival •  
Continental breakfast •  Tickets to the CO UN TR Y  
SQUIRE DINNER THEATRE (Tues thru Sat 
beverages not included) •  Or. dinner for two at the 
Villa Inn Club •  Unlimited swimming in the indoor 
pool And that’s not all! Children stay FREE when 
occupying the same room as their parents

This otter is good 7 days a week through May 31. 1W1

R eservations should be made one week in  advance 
C a ll I 8<W <72 ISM

•P ure per aduli per n«ibt plo* M« haarrTw, W iuM r .» (up.,™ v

r-*t*vvTT IP

0Le • f t) ,

JV  B ronchos b rin g  
hom e d istric t title
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The Clarendon Broncho 
J.V. Boys Track Team cap­
tured the District J.V. Track 
Championship at Canadian 
last Thursday. It was an 
exciting team effort and the 
victory was not secured until 
the final event of the day 
when the Bronchos won the 
1600 meter relay. The J.V. 
Bronchos who have com­
peted against varsity com­
petition for over half of the 
season used the J.V. meet to 
show just how good they are 
when competing at their own 
level. This group of young 
men show great potential for 
future varsity teams and 
figure in the plans of the 
Bronchos as they strive to 
extend their consecutive dis­
trict championship string to 
five. J.V. Bronchos who 
competed and scored points 
at the district meet were as 
follows:

SHOT PUT
Ken Dorris 4th

DISCUS
Mark McAnear 1st, Ken 
Dorris 4th

LONG JUMP
Ray Lindley 4th, John Brax­
ton 6th

HIGH JUMP
Jr. Crump. Brad Woodman 

400 METER RELAY
Jr. Crump, Ray Lindley,

Brad Woodman, John Brax­
ton 1st

3200 METER RUN 
Doug Walker 1st. Richard 
Gaines 2nd, Mark McAnear
3rd

110 METER HIGH 
HURDLES

Jr. Crump 2nd. Kelly Hill 4th 
800 METER DASH

Billy Perry 6th, Neal John­
ston 5th

100 METER DASH
Ray Lindley 3rd, Jr. Crump 
4th

400 METER DASH
Dyron Howell 2nd, Richard 
Gaines 6th

300 METER INTER. 
HURDLES

Creed Wright 1st, Kelly Hill 
4th, Brad Woodman 5th 

200 METER DASH 
Ray Lindley 2nd, John Brax­
ton 3rd

1600 RUN
Billy Perry 3rd. Doug Walker 
4th Jeff Helms 6th 

1600 RELAY
Brad Woodman, John Brax­
ton, Creed Wright. Dyron 
Howell 1st

Other J.V. Bronchos who 
competed in the meet were 
Rodney McAnear, Todd 
Muse, Fabian Torres, Keith 
Reese, Tommy Nichols, Scott 
Newland.
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Clarendon School menu 
April 27-May 1 ,1981

Monday Butter fish with 
catsup, cole slaw, cheese 
slice, cornbread. pudding 
and milk.

Tuesday Pizza with 
cheese, tossed salad, butter­
ed com. peanut butter Reese 
and milk.

Wednesday Pig in Blanket 
with mustard, cheese slice, 
turnip greens, mashed pota­
toes. pineapple tips and 
milk.

Thuraday Spagetti with 
meat sauce, mashed pota­
toes. green beans, hot rolls, 
apple sauce and milk.

Friday Bar-B-Q on bun. 
lettuce and tomatoes, potato 
salad, prune cake and milk.

Hedley School menu 
April 27-May 1,1981

Monday Spaghetti with 
meat sauce, blackeye peas, 
fried okra, hot rolls, stewed 
raisins and milk.

Tuesday Enchiladas chic­
ken. baked beans, green 
salad, cheese, ice box cook­
ies and milk.

Wednesday Pinto beans, 
macaroni and tomatoes, 
spinach, cornbread. fruit and 
milk.

T h u rsd a y  B a rb e q u e
franks, cheese, com. green 
beans, hot rolls, banana 
pudding and milk.

Friday Com dogs with 
mustard, potato rounds, ket­
chup. fruit cobbler and milk.
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High Schools all sports banquet 

will be April 28th

/
Apr. 24-25

Apr. 25 
May 1-2
Mav 8-9

Regional Qualifiers 
Regional Odessa

Girls
Regional-Odessa

State-Austin

May 15-16 State-Austin
* * * * *
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By KATIE DVOKAK 
The Texas Paths 

Wildlife Departmeat re­
minds owners of private 
lakes and stock t«nk« that 
fish for sto r in g  private 
waters no longer are avail­
able from the agency. Land- 
owners may obtain a list of 
licensed fish dealers from the 
Inland F ish eries Branch, 
Canyon by calling Joe Kraai, 
pronounced “ cry", at 806- 
655-4341.

Lake Houston is like the 
homely girl next door who is 
suddenly 26 and beautiful. 
This 12,000 acre reservoir 
nestled on the northeast 
corner of the spraw ling  
Houston metro area may be

beaded for increased atten­
tion.

The shallow and slightly 
murky lake is not a large- 
mouth bass hot spot since it 
lacks the type of cover re­
quired to support them. But 
it ranges from good to out­
standing in production of 
blue, flathead and channel 
catfish and the highly popu­
lar crappie are in abundance 
in those murky waters.

The striped/white bass 
hybrids have been stocked on 
two occasions and anglers 
already have caught individ­
ual hybrids weighing five to 
six pounds. A recent survey 
of fish in the lake by the 
Inland fisheries deoartment

N O R P P
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FOB THE BEST OF BOTH WORLDS-

Reduced Rate* mad FaD Ltee 
Personalised Service

•BOATS 
•BONDS 
•TRUCKS 
•LIVESTOCK 
•HOMEOWNERS 
•AUTOMOBILES 
•MOTORCYCLES 
•MOBILE HOMES 
•NOTARY BONDS 
•LIFE INSURANCE 
•TRIP INSURANCE 
•HOSPITALIZATION 
•GENERAL LIABILITY 
•WORKMEN'S COMPENSATION

Drawer A 
rW ewdoe, Texas 79226

1806] 874-3521

6-Month Money Martlet C D

NOW PAYS 13.871 ON 810.000 
MINIMUM

Federal Regulation. prohibit the 
Interest durian the torsi of the ac

30 Month Treasury Rate C D

12% ~  12.938%
81,000 Mlnhsato Deposit Reqaired

Sabo tan dal Internet penalty req aired for early 
withdrawal from Certificate of Deposit.

All accounts Insured to S I00.000.00

Effective January 2, 1981 
New Office Hows:

Mon. through Tliurs. 9:00—3:00 
Fridays 9:00—4:08 

Memphis Branch

Vernon Savings and Loan
Member of FSUC

. 1 1 *  So rt «tt S t 259-3344
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showed that there are 516 

cstfish, 232 blue
88 Urgetnough b sss 

sou s m  crappie  per acre.
Lake Houston is excellent 

for bant fishermen, but bank 
fishing is difficult in som e 
areas because most of the 
shoreline is private property. 
This sounds like s  good place 
to visit, but I wouldn't want 
to stay there.

To reach Lake Houston, 
take 59 to Humble, then FM 
1960 to the Marina.

It’s time to be getting your 
fishing gear in the water. 
Some people in town have 
been cleaning their boats, 
checking out their motors 
and straightening out their 
tackle boxes. It is a good idea 
to begin to save plastic jugs 
so you can set out trot lines, 
too. From the reports of 
those who run trot lines, the 
rewards are worth the daily 
effort.

I'm sure you were aware 
that the Broasted Chicken 
concession at the lake has 
been re-opened. This means 
that you can make a big day 
of it, boating, fishing, 
swimming, or just watching 
swim suits walk by and not 
have to pack in your lunch.
The advantages of having 
that concession open will 
be readily seen this summer 
when families want to spend 
the day away but Mom 
doesn't want to spend the 
night fixing a lunch and 
packing it. cooking it and 
bringing home dirty things to 
clean. Hurray for Jack Daniel 
and the Broasted Chicken 
stand!

If you own a boat and 
trailer, remember that you /a 
must get your trailer tags 1  
renewed a the tax office. You 
can't pull your boat trailer 
with an expired tag and 
expect to get away with it 
every day. Be sure that your 
lights and signals work as 
well. What a shame it would 
be to make that right hand 
turn into the lake and have 
someone smash your boat 
from the rear because they 
didn't know you were turn­
ing.

Be sure your fishing 
license is current and that all 
members of your party have 
licenses and life jackets. It 
wouldn't hurt to review the 
lake rules as well. There are 
some things we tend to 
forget from season to season. 
Why not buy a family ticket 
to use the’lake for a year? I 
think that is one of the best 
buys you can make for cm 
mer family fun. Use the lake, 
it is our own civic duty I 
Teach the kids to swim and 
learn and use wise boaters 
safety. If you don't know 
boating safety rules, contact 
Gary Hunt, the Game War­
den for information concern­
ing the rules and regulations 
of safe boating.

L et's keep G reenbelt’s 
record clean this year and not 
have any accidents or foolish 
loss of life because of stupid­
ity. Fishermen are NOT 
exempt from these rules, 
either. In fact, since a fish­
erman tends to lie more than 
the average man. it might be 
a good idea for fishermen to 
be given an oral test over 
boating safety just to be sure 
tney really do know the 
rules 1

Funeral service* for Mr. 
Woodrow M oan, age 67. 
former reaideat o f Claren­
don, and Donley County, and 
a resident of Odessa for the 
past three years, were held 
st 11:00 s.m . on Tuesday,. 
April 21, 1981, in Robertson 
Chapel Of Memories, with 
Rev. Paul Heil, pastor of the 
First Baptist Church, offici­
ating. Interment was in Citi­
zens Cemetery with the ar­
rangements under the direc­
tion of Robertson Funeral 
Directors.

Mr. Moore died on Satur­
day morning, April 18, 1981 
in Odessa at the home of his 
sister, Mrs. C. A. Graham, 
(form erly M rs. Johnny 
Beard). He was bom on 
December 1.1913 at Duncan,

Oklahoma. He w aited aa a  
welder and reaided in Clar­
endon for aeveral year* be­
tween 1930 and 1965. He

CAN TR ILL LP G A S
d i i s h l

Ju n io r Mill 3*8-3331 

H arold  N aal 374-2738

Salas 4  "Coaiplata Sarvlcal
New  p r o p a n e  tan k s

Wo Have Spring Bulbs
★  Dahlia

m\ \ M

' ★  Peonies *  D a y Lillies
★  T ig e r Lillies 

★  Lillies eff the V a lle y

Deed selection of tra it and shade trees

C O D FR IY  NURSERY
W est Edge Memphis on 

Memphis, Texas

8 x 1 0  Color Portrait - $
Your choice of family group or individua 

One apecial offer per family, one per perse

T U M B LE W E ED  C LO T H E S
Tuesday April 28th 

Photo Hours 10 00 a m -4  00pm
C LA R EN D O N . TX.

^ / e r f l u r e

AFFILIATED 
FOODS,INC.

Charlie's Groceryt & Market,
W ' Double S4H Green Stamps W ednesday with S 2.00 purchase.

COeekfi^f S la e e S a e A -
LUNCHEON MEAT

Arm our 
Treet 12 OZ. 

CAN

ALL GRINDS

WHITE CLOUD

Bathroom
Issue 4 ROLL 

PKG.

LIQUID

% GAL 
BTL.

CALIFORNIA LARGE GREEN SKIN

Avocados
S'

FOR

HOMESTEAD EXEM PTION
A N D

A O  U S I VALUE FOR SCHOOL TA X ES
The Clarendon C.I.S.D. hereby announces that all persons 
are entitled to receive an exemption of $5,000 from the market 
value of their residence homestead for the purpose of school 
taxes. In addition, all persons who are 65 or older or under a 
disability for purposes of payment of disability benefits under 
Federal Old-Age, Survivors, and Disability Insurance are also 
entitled to an additional exemption of 810,000 from the 
market value of their residence homesteads for the purpose of 
school taxes. Also all persons owning land that Is currently 
devoted principally to agricultural use for at leaat five [5] of 
the preceding seven [7) years may file an application of 
agriculture land use. The application classifies the value of 
l«„H considering the agricultural use to which the land Is 
principally devoted and the average annual net Income 
derived from ite use.

WASHINGTON R ID  OR G O L D IN  DELIC IOUS

Apples
TEXAS GREEN m gte

Cabbage lb 1 a

39* to« , o.. - 59*
2/49*

- DAW Y ft FROZEN FOODS
10‘ OFF LABEL TOOTHPASTE

2 7 02 
TUBE

KRAFT CHILLED

Orange Juice
KRAFT

Parhay

Vr GAL ' 
BTL

KRAFT

1 lb qto.

Minute Meld
Lemonade 6 oz

Shurflne

EACH

15c off Islw i

To qualify for these exemptions, an application must be filed 
with the school district tax office by April 30, 1981. 
Application forms are available at the School Tax Office.

fi»a®‘

M .
■ SHELF SPECIALS”

■ ■
u t f s u  I * LUIXU

Spaghetti
HUNT JEMIMA

Pancake Mix
Premium 1 lb box

CraeharB

10 oz
PKG

2 LB 
BOX

Cam pbells Chicken Noodle

Clarendon Consolidated 
Independent School District

Cala Jo  T ro u t, T a x  Assassor-Collactoi 

418 3 . A llo a  C larendon, To i

COKES AFFILIATED 
FOODS INC.

’ PRICES EFFECTIVE April 22-25. 1981 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES

DEL MONTE

DEL MONTE

DEL MONTE HALVED

Apricots

79e17 02 
CAN

DEL MONTE BARTLETT

Pear Halves

69e16 02 
CAN

DEL MONTE
SLICED YELLOW CLING

Peaches

59

DEL MONTE CRINKLE

Cat Beets3 $10016 oz 3
CANS B  

DEL MONTE ITALIAN CUT

Green Beans

2 89c
DEL MONTE

VAC RAK WHOLE KERNEL

16 02 
CAN 12 0 2  

CANS

U S D.A GRADE A COUNTRY PRIDE 
CERTIFIED FINEST QUALITY WHOLE

WILSON CERTIFIED SLICED

Bacon
$ |  391 LB 

PKG

_________  REGULAR

Meat Franks 1202
1 LB 
PKG

_________  SLICED

Bologna
HORMEL PORK LINK SAUSAGE

L il  Sizzlers
WRIGHT S SLICED

Bacon u>
ARMOUR S PRE COOKED c h ic k e n  e r iiw

Beef Patties

U S D A  GRAOE A 
COUNTRY PRIDE

CERTIFIED FINEST QUALITY FRYER*
CUT UP PAN READY ___

Whole Fryers
SPLIT FRYER

Breast
FRYER

Thighs
FRYER

Drumsticks

the price fighter

WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS 
WE ACCEPT MANUFACTURER 8 COUPONS i

. . . ; • .
W re proud to give you more!



SHOP WITHOUT GOING 
■hopping, the Amwiy way. 
Amway products delivered to 
yoor home. Call 874-2659

71-tfc

Memphis
Singer Sewing Machine 

Sales Service 
For contacts call 

Goodman Furniture 
I am in Clarendon every twc 

weeks on Thursday 43-tf

LAMPS, LAMP PARTS, 
■U Ught bulbs

HOUSE OFSHADES

LAMP REPAIR 
Wolf!In Village 
Wolflln Avenue 

Amarillo, T es. 79019

If you don’t like to cook, let 
aomeone de It for you who 
does. Let me bake for your 
every day need) 
ocraafona. Now I 
for all kinds of ! 
goods. Will

WaiECaD
3904.

at 874- 
2-tic

ALTERNATIVE
Alternative to an abortion for 
an untimely pregnancy Call 
THE EDNA GLADNEY 
HOME Texas Toll-Free 
1-800-792-1104 51-tfc
LOST load of clothes Sunday 
night at Rainbow Laundry, 
$20.00 reward offered. Call 
collect after 7, 856-3431.

17-2tc

CAMPER FOR SALE: 21’ 
■elf-contained; gas or electric 
ice box; pressure water sup­
ply, dual axle; lots of stor­
age, AC or battery powered; 
air conditioned, sleeps six. 
Trailblazer, good condition. 
$2,500 or trade for fold-out 
camper. 874-3853 17-ltc

TV CABLE SERVICE 
Six Clear <
Pina FM Ms 

Two Continuous Weather 
Scans on Channels 9 and 13 
For Information and service 

CaR 874-3570
CLARENDON CABLE TV^

Wo have a l  types of Hospital 
■t for runt or aale, 

wheelchairs, walkers, 
4c. Sue Mike 

at Glbaon’a Pharmacy 
874-3554.

Mrs. Bond’s Baking
Located at Mobil Home 
South on Koogle at the 

First turn west. 874-3355 
49-tfc

ROTO-TILLING, yard or 
garden, reasonable rates. 
Paul Drager 874-2087 15-tfc

FOR RENT 
TV SETS FOR RENT 
Inquire at Henaona

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, L.R. and dining com­
bination, kitchen, den, storm 
cellar, shop room, double 
carport. Beautiful view of 
lake. Howardwick across 
from postoffice. Call 874- 
2156. l*-5tc

NEW AND USED 
Vlbro Steam Carpet Cleaning 

Equlpmeat-50% financing 
avallable-Call 806-353-7578 

or 372-9413 or 359-0667 
1 7 ,1 9 ,21-tfc

FOR SALE: Used mill equip­
ment; used lumber; used van 
body, 18 ft. long with hy­
draulic lift; Leo Feed Mill; 
Also BUYING scrap iron. 
874-3950 17-ltp

C H A M B ER LA IN  M O TO R  A
O

ilk

*
«<

C lifford  about now or 

osod tors yoo m ay

doolro. — If w o don't 

h a vo  tko car yoo w a n t!

rig h t now , to ll Prod 

C lifford and ho w ill do 

h it host to fiad it. 

M o n ty  of financing

n o n o y  still a va ila b le  on 

now cars w ith  a p p ro vo d

crodlt and tho intorost
#

ra te  hasn't gono op.

C f t a m 6 « / i £ a i n
TO R  C O M P A N Y

5

i

o
0  
*
A
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HIGHWAY 287 CLARENDON, TEXAS 
BUICK • OLDSMOBILE 

PONTIAC • CADILLAC • GMC TRUCKS

fh c u  currono 
H orn. «74-2*»» 
Toll Free Tease
800-692-4068

Clarendon (806) 874 3527 
Amarillo 376 9041 

Texas WATS (800) 692 4088

8
' X 4

*
v

5 'Tjnsr&n&mFAkY 5
■A - r r u - ir-i- j i-a i ------- ‘------------ —

2 BDRM Bm m  3
t B^y 874-2675.

16-2tc
latch hook 

kits and patterns, needle­
points, crewel kits, macrame 
supplies. SALE: plastic mesh 
sheets 1054 x 13 VS sheets 
$2.39. Dana of Canyon. 
16-3tc

DRY FERTILIZER

OFFICE SUPPLIES 
Bookkeeping Supplies 

Storage Boxes 
Office Machine Ribbon.

Office Furniture 
Clarendon Office Supply 

and Printing 
G.W. Estlack 

Clarendon, TX 79226

STALLIO N S T A N D I N G
Cocopah, Jockey Club 
#6918037 Sire-Honey’s Alibi 
Dam-Aptalon 806-983-3077.

15-4tc

Clarendon 
Lodge 700 AF/AM  

Stated meeting:
Second Monday, 8 P l ­
each month
Practice: 1st A 4th Mondays 
Cecil Mathews, W.M.
Billy Ray Johnston, Sec

FOR SALE: False fireplace, 
gas logs, imitation logs, 46 x 
36 mirror, forced air central 
furnace, 8,5000 BTU, 1 plan­
ter lamp and 1 swag lamp. 
Willard Hudson 874-3401.

17-ltc
WANTED: 4 row, row mark­
ers 874-2277 ifter 6 p.m .

17-ltc
GODFREY 

PEST CONTROL 
Memphis, Tex.

259-2766
Contact: Pat Godfrey 

Good Work 
Reasonable Price

COMMERCIAL PRINTING 
Business and Personal 

Stationery k  Cards 
Business Forms 
& Statements 

Window Cards 
Whatever your printing 

needs, check with us. 
CLARENDON OFFICE 
SUPPLY & PRINTING 

Mr. k  Mrs. G.W. Estlack 
Phone 874-2043 

Clarendon. TX 79226

LAKE LOT for sale on 
Greenbelt. Call 806-274-6500

16- 3tc

FOR SALE: 42 gallon pro­
pane tank $150 00 874-3904 
Randy Wa-J 17-ltp

FREE German Shephard- 
type puppies, E. Front - N. 
McClellan. Calvin McCrary.

17- ltp

Recently remodeled home and 4.7 acres V• mile 
East of Hedley. Completely fenced with Boll 

Many fruit and nut trees. Numerous 
grapevines. 2 wells with submersible pump# in 
addition to city water. The very best soil for 
garden and truck crops. Nice chicken boose. 
Concrete cellar. House is 2 bedroom, nice else, 
1 bath, living room, kitchen, linen and cedar 
closets, utility room and attached 1 car garage. 
Everything you have wished for in a country

Joe T. Lovell, Broker 
874-3556 /  226-3801

1981

Goodnight Land A  
Livestock Co.

Jioi G a rla n d  - B ro k e r 
806-944-5458

Financing k  refinancing funds available for 
any sound business.

MAE PEARL'S FABRICS 
720 S. Allen 874-2056 

s, Texas

■ ■ tfc j
For Sale: 1976 Olds 98, 
4-door, sedan, loaded-clean. 
Low mileage, good rubber. 
One owner. Sacrifice for 
$2995.874-2382. 15-2tc

FOR SALE: 500 gal. L.P. 
tank with wet line. Don 
Springer 856-3141 15-tfc

THANK YOU 
Thank you for the kind 

expression of your sympathy 
in the loss of our loved one. 
The Johnny Leathers Family 
16-ltp

HOUSE FOR SALE: As is, 2 
BR, 1 bath, LR. DR, Kitchen, 
Detached Garage with BR 
and '/: Bath, Johnson Street, 
next to American Legion 
Hall, Hedley, Texas. Consi­
der any reasonable offer. 
(806)856-3471. 15-3tc

THANK YOU
Don and 1 would like to say 

thank you to all of our good 
Christian friends for their 
visits to the hospital and at 
home. Thank you so much for 
the food, flowers, and phone 
calls.

May Gods good hand 
guide and bless each of you.

In Christian Love 
The Don Wootens 

17-ltp

HELP WANTED General all 
around help on the golf 
course and someone to cook 
and clean for the country 
club weekdays or weekends 
call 874-2166 or 874-2863.

17-ltc

CATERING
aM  Qcca&is*b-

/  /  xtrfV*
M .urine Butte 

874-3829 or 
Brenda Ward 

874-3904

Do you want to live in a 
nice community with good 
churches, schools and a jun­
ior college?

Call For An Appotui

To see several two A three 
bedroom dwellings which I 
have listed. These are both 
brick veneer and stucco. Also 
have a few outside of the city 
with small acreage.

I am also offering a good 
selection of lots at Greenbelt 
Lake. Several homes are also 
available. These are located 
7 miles north of Garendon 
where good fishing and 
boating provides excellent 
recreation.

Call For An Appointment

Clyde Price Real Estate 
806874-3896 

Clarendon, Texas

MOVING SALE: Lawnmow- 
er, TV stand, 22 cup coffee- 
maker, Gairol foot fixer, sun 
lamp, laundry soap, twin bed 
and springs, roll-away bed 
stove hood, double-sink 
metal lawn loungers, can 
ning jars, hanging lamp 
wrought iron chandlier. 874 
3860. 17-ltp

s 'M SH ILL

CUSTOM
FARM ING

A
W ILD IN G

Call
John N a ylo r 

874-1660

SAVE!! FREE DELIVERY 
Cedar fencing materials or 
torn key. Heavy shake. 
$65.00. All other tvpe cedar 
r o o t i n g ,  c o m p o s i t i o n  
shingles and felt. Turn key 
roofing.

Lakeside W holesaler.

Drawer L 
Frltch, Texas 
79036
806-857-2411

DEEN CONSTRUCTION

"No Job Too Large or Too Small”
Call Anytime

[806] 874-2615
mo........ tr  -ir — --------**-----*

STEEL BUILDINGS

-Give us your specifications for your Steel 
Buildings and we will build to suit yoo.

•QUICK AND EXPERIENCED ERECTION

-Compare our designs and 
buildings.

prices with other

PHILLIPS 
GIN SERVICE

B a rry  Phillips
*  *_ * * * * * * *

8 7 4 - 1 1 3 6
a . . . . . . .

VACUUM  CLEANER 
SERVICE

We specialize in Kirby Vacuum Cleaner Sale, 
and Service but will repair any make vacuum 
cleaner. We pick up and deliver as well as loan 
you one while we're repairing vours. Call u. 
anytime. 8/4-3403

John D. and Lois McVicker 
119 Walleye Street 

Howardwick. Texas

4 COUNTY TRACTOR & EQPT., INC
Memphis. Texas

Jerry Healer, Mgr.

Jim m y L indsey  
P arts M gr. 

P h on e 259-3248

D ave G arrison' 
S erv ice  M gr. 

P h on e 259-2187

P ee W ee S im m o n . 
S alesm an  

P hone 259-2447

24 HOUR PARTS & SERVICE AVAILABLE
( all 806/259 3514

brown-McMurtry Implement

4&I
SALES AND SERVICE 
FHONE 806-823-2441 
BOX 777
SILVERTON, TEXAS 79257

DON BROWN 
HOME PH. 823-2292

CLARENCE WARD 
HOME PH. 823-2083

R A Y ' S
APPLIANCE S E P  VICE

& r rsnehise For
Kitchen Aid Dishwashers

Sales and Service °/ 
General Electric Franchise Dealer ^  ‘ Heating and Air Conditioning

We service all makes of Air Conditioner.
Freezer & Refrigeration Service A Repair.

TERM ITE PROBLEMS
Call for the beat termite control 

Over 20 year, experience 
Call Collect 383-7075 

3608 N.E. 23rd 
Amarillo, Texaa 79107 

State Lie. No. 1178 
Owner Operator

LEO R U SS EU( T

M ORROW 'S R ID I-M IX
★ Ready M ixed  Concrete  

it Backhoe it (Storm Cellars)

All Typ e s  Camera to Work 
Marl M o rro w  -  O w mar 874-2571

B A ILEY  ESTES 
A N D  SON

W ILDIN G FABR ICATIN G
Mmaimolod Steel Bwilcffiegs 

Custom P o rta b le  Buildlmgt 
BARM S

FARMERS WELDING 
A N D  SUPPLY CO

Highway 70 South
Clarendon, Texas Bob Trout-manager

Wood burning atoves-frsm, oil, sir and fuel flltera-motor 
oil-inner tn b es-grsd e 5 bolts-key stock-in terstate- 
batteries-stoel, angles, channels etc.-used farm equip­
ment. A welding shop to do fabrication and repairs.

CONSTRUCTION 
S IR V IC IS  CO.

Carrol Kennedy and Gary Stewart 
New Construction and Remodeling, Complete Cabinet 

Shop • Complete Saw Sharpening Shop. 
Located at Fanners Welding and Supply Building

CARL'S R IK I SHOP
Carl Klinnert-owner and operator 

/  Bicycles repaired and rebuilt
We have used bikes for sale and some used tricycles.

Located at Farmers Welding and Supply Building.

Telephone nuoibar for all 
tha above ■ Baslaoss at 

FAR M ER S W ELDING A N P  
S U P P LY

is 806-874-3771
OOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOCi
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ROOT HILL!!

W O M IN 'S  W I I T I R N  
I P M T I  W M I  A N D

W I I T n N  W IA R
by

P R IZISI DRAW INOS!
SPECIALS EACH HOUR — PLUS

C H A M B E R L A I N
W I W S M i n .. .n-nr-v,

I at least 10% • *  Regular Price

OP IVSR YTH IN O I!

I I ! * • • *  t l

800T

HI
Hondo
Adam*
Taxes
Acme

I f

Tony Lama
Nocona
Justin
Oisan-Stalzar

Wrangler Rasistoi

INC. \ . /  WESTERN
V WEAR

Amarillo's Cowboy Shop”

(S06) 312-7591 / 4315 W. 45TM / AMARILLO. TEXAS 79109

M ee.-Pri. 10-8» Sal. 10-0

Chamberlain Community Center held their 
regular meeting Friday night, April 17. Host 
and hoatesaes were Roy and Ruby Blackman nd 
Opal Darnell. A fair crowd attended. Our next 
meeting will be Friday, May 1st. Come if you 
can.

Mr. and Mrs. D.C. Thomason of Wellington 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Frank Thomason Tues­
day.

Frances and Gene Grimland and Ruby Jewel 
and Warren Hardin visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Thursday night.

Vivian and Kevin Phelps of Houston spent 
Easter weekend with Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Thomason.

Carrol and Renee Duncan and Tanya and 
Vivian Phelps and Mrs. Annie Thomason 
attended the A.L. Duncan family reunion in 
Wellington Saturday.

Charles Blackburn brought his father, Mr. 
J.C. Blackburn home from the Amarillo 
hospital Friday. He’s doing pretty good.

Kerry and Rander Cannon and little boys 
spent Friday night with Mrs. Richard Cannon.

Tanya Duncan of Abilene spent the weekend 
with Carrol and Renee Duncan and Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Thomason.

Mrs. Pauline Koontz visited her mother Mrs. 
Fannie Stone and Mrs. Blanche Smith Friday 
afternoon at Medical Center Nursing Home.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Ferguson and little girls 
of Darrouzett spent the weekend with Ewayne 
and Janice Barbee and little Beth.

Jake and Bertie Faye Corbin of Amarillo and 
Donald and Bradis Ballew were dinner guests 
of Ruth and Nell Corbin Sunday.

Jack and Iona Reid and Mrs. Clara Mae 
Carter visited Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Carter of 
Irving and Mr. and Mrs. Leon Carter of 
Sherman visited with them, too.

We were glad to know Mrs. Mary Myers is 
able to be home from the hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Dingier visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Hal Riley Sunday afternoon.

David and Betty Lane visited Dennis and 
Loretta Harrison Saturday night.

Teresa and Miles Risley of Amarillo spent 
the weekend with Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Blackburn, and Butch Blackburn visited Satur­
day night.

Mr. and Mrs. Ron Monroe and three little 
girls of Littleton, Colorado visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Thomason Sunday.

Kerry and Randee Cannon and little boys 
were dinner guests of Dennis and Loretta 
Harrison and Anna, and visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Hawley Harrison in the afternoon, before going 
to Wichita Falls to visit her family for Easter

OPENING
CORONADO COMMUNITY HOSPITAL 

Member ef Hospital Corporation of America 
RNs

R egistered n arses needed sew  for orlentstlon  sod  
development In preparation of oar new facility. Areas 
sv si table Include ICU-CCU, ER and OB.
Benefits Available:
1. Competitive salary
2. Transfenable benefits to and from other HCA
3. Folly paid retirement program [6% of gross annual income)
4. Flexible staffing boors
5. Stock purchase program
6. Internal and external con tinning education available

Cal) collect Coronado Community Hospital 806 66S-7421, 
Coronado Community Hospital, 1224 N. Hobart, Pam pa, 
Texas 79065

An equal opportunity employer

and Ethel fBBdbjr night.
Mr. and Mr*. Tom Barbee of Quitaque 

visited Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Barbee aad they 
all visited Jan aad Barry Schafer of Childress 
Sunday afternoon..

Mr. and Mrs. James Morgan and children of 
Wichita Falla, and Mr. and Mrs. Jetty Koontz 
and family, and Mr. and Mrs. Roy Lee Helms 
and family of Lelia Lake spent Easter Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Delmar Koontz.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Corder Sr., and Kathy 
and Orville Swanson, Willie and Jamie 
returned Monday from an Easter weekend 
visiting their daughter, Marie and Steve 
Hatfield of Rapid City, South Dakota, and they 
toured the *‘Bad Lands" Friday, and the 
"Black H ills” Saturday, and saw Mt. Rush- 
more.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Chaney of Amarillo 
visited his brother Mr. and Mrs. W.R. Chaney 
Friday.

Mrs. Carmen Wright went to Dallas with Mr. 
and Mrs. Dalton James and visited her son Mr. 
and Mrs. John Summers, Scotty and Nicholux 
and Mr. and Mrs. Jones visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Hall, Lisa and Amy of Seagoville 
for the Easter holidays.

Mrs. Nell Fobes of Burbank, Ca., Hawley 
Harrison’s sister took her drivers license test 
and won her drivers license for four years. She 
will be 86 her birthday. She missed five out of 
30 questions.

Audra Hoggard 
turns eight

Those helping Andra cele­
brate this occasion were 
Kelly Havens, Tracye Floyd,
Bridget Bland, Shonda Phil 
lips, Tylena Bright, Jill Kidd,
Marlena Page, Brandy Var- 
gus, Kim and Katie Hodges,
Kim McAfee, Jeff Annis,
Bryan Denny, Shane Hall,
Justin, Helm, Michael Wil­
liams, Darren Rushing, Jim 
Bob Fricks, Krista Percival,
Gene Hall, Misty Longan,
Chantel Thomas, Rogina 
Gray, Krystel Stoup. Gilbert,
K atrina Leathers, Iriva 
Denny. Michelle Thompson,
Taylor Ann Harbert, Chad 
Ellis, Toby Leffew, Lance 
Baker, Robert Lee, Ruby 
Bromley, Jared Estes, Blake 
Smith. Laura Ann Hicks,
Jam es Lampier, Heather 
McCord, Mr. and Mrs.

* Gene Swearingen, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clyde Hoggard, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Lemons, Mr. 
and Mrs. Timmy Wigginton 
and Dawn. Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Davis. Gene and Rey, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bobby Hoggard,
Billy Bob and Candi, Mary 
Guigo, and Suzanne Esqui- 
val.

Cal l  y o u r  l ocal  u s e d  cot 

d e a l e r  f o r  

d e a d  sre fk r e m o v a l  

1 -800-692-4043 
t o l l  f r e e

LAND OWNERS

Appraisal of all real estate in Donley County is being done 
for the Donley Appraisal District. Land will be described by 
use category and productive capacity from existing records to 
reach estimated market value.

newt
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Visiting b  the home 
Mr. and Mrs . Otis 
was Mr. aad Mr*. Theo 
Swinncy from St. Loub. Mo. 
They also visited other rela­
tives and friends in Hedley.

Johnny Stiles visited over 
the weekend with his grand­
mother Mrs. Jeasb Stiles. 
Johnny b  from Amarillo.

Mrs. Madge aad Loyd 
Richardson were in Hedley 
W ednesday. They had lunch 
at the Senior Citizens where 
they got to see many friends.

Virgil McPherson was in 
McLean Saturday to visit 
with his brother Bryan.

Sympathy b  extended to 
Mr. J.R. (Shorty) Floyd’s 
family by his many Hedley 
friends.

Sorry to hear that Mrs. 
Nell Land was taken to 
hospital in Wellington Friday 
evening.

Mrs. F.J. Cherry had 
Easter compnay, Mr. and 
Mrs. Royce Crisler of Mid­
land and her grandson Mike 
and baby.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Moore 
from Houston visited his 
mother Mrs. Beth Moore. 
They also visited with L.D. 
Moore and family.

Mrs. Beth Moore spent 
Easter Sunday at Memphis 
with L.D. Moore and family.

Roy Hunnicutt visited this 
week with the Burt Stones.

l i d S f IK  T l  FIRST TNI KINGDOM OF GOD'

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to express our 

appreciation to our friends in 
Hedley, Clarendon and Hall 
Co. who called, visited, sent 
food, cards, flowers,a nd 
cemetery memorials or ex­
pressed condolences in any 
way, during our bereave­
ment in the loss of our Uncle 
Truman B. (Shorty) Floyd.

Our special thanks to Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Moffett for 
opening their home in Mem­
phis to the many relations. 
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Hoggard 

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Hoggard and family 

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Lemons 
and family

However, there is no generally available Information as to I A ffairs of TGfc 
boundary lines of specific tracts within a section or survey of 
rural land. If you own parts of sections or surveys, please 
come by the Appraisal Office in the Northwest comer of the 
Court House Annex and draw in the boundary lines on the 
county map so that we can have the most accurate record of 
ownership location for your and our benefit. Most acreage 
owners will receive a plat questionaire in the mail which can 
be mailed or brought to the Appraisal Office but the best way 
is for you to draw on our map.

Tobacco makes a good 
animal dewormer.

Smoking is glamorous 
for the human: but what 
are the end results?

CALVARY BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Hwy. 287 A Jackson 
874-3479

. R.W. Sullivan, Pastor 
? Sunday School 10:60 a.m.
} Sunday Worship 11:00a.m.
I Training Union 6:30 p.m.
I Evening Worship 7:30 p.m.
• Wednesday
, Night Service 7:30 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Bug bee A Third Streets 

874-3833 
Paul Hell, Pastor 

> Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.

, Training Union 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 

Wednesday
Night Service 7:00 p.m.

ST. MARK BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Jefferson A Martindale 
Albert Yarborough, Pastor 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Preaching 11:00 a.m.
Night Service 8:30 p.m. 
Prayer Service 7:30 p.m. 
Woman’s Mission 8:00 p.m.

MARTIN BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Robert Shugart, Pastor 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Chorch Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday
Night Service 7:00 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Howardwick

SBC
Jack Daniel, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:00
Worship Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday
Prayer M eeting 6:00 p.m

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Hedley

856-2711 •
Wayne Naylor, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00a.m .
Evening 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service 6:30 p.m.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
5th A McClelland 

Roger Gray, Pastor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Sunday Worship 11:00 a.m . 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m. 

Tuesday
Women’s
Missionary 1 KM p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service 7:30 p.m.

CHURCH OF THE 
NAZARENE 

3rd A Hawley 
874-2321

BUI Hodges, Pastor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday
Night Service 7:30 p.m.

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
4th A Parks 

874-3428
Dr. E.L. Manning, Pastor 

Sunday School HhOO a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Youth Program 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 

Tuesday
Bible Study 2:30 p.m.

ST. JOHN BAPTIST 
EPISCOPAL 
3rd A Parks

Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Services 11:00 a.m.

Rev. J. Scott Turner 
874-2231

CLARENDON LUTHERAN 
MISSION 

3rd and Parks 
874-2087 

Rev. Jack Amen 
Faith Lutheran Church 

AmariDa, Texas

(Services held in St. John 
Baptist Episcopal)
Each Second Sunday

Holy Communion Services 
2:30 p.m.

FIRST CHRISTIAN 
CHURCH

WUbert Bernabe, Pastor 
3rd A G ent

Sunday School 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday
Night Service 6:00 p.m. 
Night Service 7:30 p.m.

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
4th A Carhart 

874-2495
Sunday School 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:30 a.m . 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday
Night Service 7:30 p.m .

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
CHURCH 

Rev. Jay Fielding 
Montgomery A Faker St. 

874-3756
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11 KM a .m .. 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m . 

Wednesday
Night Service 7KM p.m.

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

5th A Jefferson 
874-3667

Wm. H. iBIll) Watson 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m . 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m . 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
Youth Program 7KM p.m .

UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Hedley, Texas 
Wm. H. [BUI] Watson 

874-3879
Sunday School 10:30 a.m . 
Morning Worship 9:30 a.m . 

Wednesday
Bible Study 6:00 p.m .

ST. MARY’S CATHOLIC 
CHURCH

McClelland A Montgomery 
Father Carbon 

Sunday Morning 
Mas* 12:15 p.m .
Holy Day* 5:00 p.m.

Father Carbon of Groom

Please come by soon!

Charles SoRelle 
Paula Lowrie 
Shirley Riley

OSBURN
FURNITURE

&
A P P L IA N C E S

• M A M  DONUT 
■YLO W  OROCIRY
■DDII FLOYD SHOP

OSBURN p u r n i t u m !

CHIYRO LST
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BUY NOW AND SAVE!
C u s to m  P o ly s te e l...T h e  Tire T h a t  
K e e p s  Its F e e t Even lr» The Rain!

the roper.
the popularity of the roptnc 

clinics has spread and Dor­
sey has been contacted for a 
number of clinics here In oar 
area and will return to Clar­
endon College nest year.

The teaming of a profes­
sional of high moral stan­
dards, young persons who 
worit with and enjoy animals , 
ami an educational Institu­
tion make for a happy finale.

New C ars

1981 Chevrolet El Camino 
purchased by James G. 
Gould. Clarendon from Al- 
derson Chevrolet.

1981 Pontiac purchased by 
Vernon Arnold, Amarillo 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 Pontiac purchased by 
Vernon Arnold, Amarillo 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 Buick purchased by 
Christena Hauser, Amarillo 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 Olds purchased by 
Agnes Ewing, Wellington, 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 GMC PU purchased by 
R.E. Ziegler, Goldsmith, 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 Pontiac purchased by 
Mary Helen Askew, Here­
ford, from Chamberlain 
Motor Co.
1981 Olds purchased by 
Chester L. Fulkerson, Ama­
rillo from Cham berlain 
Motor Co.

1981 Buick purchased by 
Plains Machinery, Amarillo 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 Olds purchased by Bea­
trice Thomas, Wellington, 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 Olds purchased by 
Limmie Mae Jackson, Pampa 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 GMC PU purchased by 
Ricky Rattan, Clarendon 
from Chamberlain Motor Co. 
1981 GMC PU purchased by 
Gene Jolly, Amarillo from 
Chamberlain Motor Co.

W
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champion, instructor

Clarendon
at 

la d o o

Twenty one persona attended the roping 
d in k  sponsored by the Clarendon College 
Rodeo Gub April 14, IS, and 16 and taught by 
internationally known roping champion and 
instructor, E.V. Dorsey.

E.V. Dorsey, who began cowboying in 
Colorado as a young teenager, was a profes­
sional rodeo contestant, top horse trainer, 
roping horse trainer, and tough contest roper.

A business assodate said of him, “ E.V. 
Dorsey, represents the finest traditions of 
rodeo performance and high ideals of personal 
living.” It takes a special individual to warrant 
that kind of statement.

Born in San Diego, Calif., June 10, 1917, 
Dorsey was orphaned at an early age. He was 
fortunate for he went to live with an aunt, 
Maggie Hood, who loved him like a mother.

E.V. attended grade school in Delta, Colo, 
and left school after the eighth grade to do 
cowboying, which he continued for several 
years. It was at the 40,000 acre Grant Ranch in 
California, with 2,000 head of cattle that he 
really began to develop his roping.

In World War II Dorsey saw service with the 
U.S. Army in the North Pacific and Germany 
before returning to roping and horses.

His favorite horse was one called Little 
Chigger, a quarter horse and the best he ever 
had, according to Dorsey.

The name Dorsey earned the respect of both 
rodeo contestants and spectators in the United 
States and abroad as he worked to perfect his 
roping and the training of his horses.

He married and is the father of a son and 
daughter, now grown. He followed his rodeo 
contesting for many years and as the years 
grew in number decided a less active life was 
desirable.

Although now less active, his life is set at a 
pretty rapid pace for most persons of any age. 
His roping clinics are much in demand. One of 
his most impressive courses of instruction was 
for the 500,000 acre Parker Ranch in Hawaii. 
The ranch ran 60,000 head of cattle, 1,000 
horses and employed about 70 cowboys, 
supervisors, managers etc.

For the past eight years Dorsey has been 
going to Hawaii and the islands of Oahu. Maui, 
Kauai and Hawaii with his roping clinics. The 
rewards must be double, satisfaction of 
furthering his profession , and the bonus of 
lovely Hawaii.

Numbered among the 21 persons who took 
advantage of the roping clinic last week were a 
young woman. Joda Cope, and a fifth grader, 
Blake Seiler.

Dorsey explained the advantage of proper 
roping as applied to ranch and stock-farming. 
Correct procedure in the use of a rope when 
handling cattle allows the handler to rope an 
animal for examination or treatment with a 
minimum of physical stress to an animal which 
may be hurt or sick. Such treatment may mean 
the life of an expensive animal for the owner.

For the member of a roping club or contest 
roper the turning of a wrist, dropping of a rope 
or other deft moves cause less physical strain 
on the animal to be roped and less wear and

tear on the hone as well as

H I N S O N S

$62
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Limited Rights Reserved 

M ail Orders Receive Prom pt Service
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1 5 %
k o m I  o a  P r e s c r i p t i o n s

DRUGS AND HEARING PROBLEMS

It has been known for many years that 
drugs can affect our hearing. Damage to the 
hearing  ap p ara tu s  is re ferred  to as 
ototoxicity. Changes in hearing may be as 
minor as a ringing or buzzing sensation or as. 
severe as permanent hearing loss. Fortun­
ately, the great majority of drugs do not 
affect our hearing. The three main groups of 
drugs that have caused problems are:

ANTIBIOTICS-A specific type of antibio­
tics called the am inoglycosides (strep­
tomycin is an exam ple) is capable of 
destroying the fine sensory hair cells in the 
inner ear. These hair cells are necessary for 
normal hearing. Loss of hearing...particular­
ly high-pitched sounds...can result from use 
of the aminoglycoside antibiotics.

SALICYLATES-Aspirin is a salicylate and 
may produce ringing or buzzing sensations... 
usually when large doses are given for 
several days. When the dosage of aspirin is 
reduced, hearing usually returns to normal. 
Some physicians use ringing in the ears as a 
guide to giving arthritic patients high doses 
of aspirin.

ANTIMALARIALS - The antimalarials 
(quinine or chloroquine as exam ples) 
can produce hearing  loss. Fortunately , 
hearing usually returns to normal when 
doses are reduced or drug discontinued.

t



O fficer* for Clarfvdoa 
College Ex-Student* Aaao- 
ciation *re Emmett 0 . 
morn, president; Jimmie Lee 
Matheson, vice pres.; Flor-

Advanccd Reservation* for 1981 Combined Clarendon College 
EX STUDENT RE UNION APRIL 25-28. 1*91

_____ Tickets for Saturday Night Dinner 86 00 each ($------------ )

_____ Tickets for Sunday Luncheon 96.00 each (I------------ )

_____ Annual M embership Dues 1981-82 92.00 each (9------------ )
Pick up tickets at Registration Table April 25th.

Indicate above num ber of tickets desired. Make check payable to 
Clarendon College Ex-Students Association.

Please M ake Your Own Motel Reservations

Sylvafoi

RSVP — By April 20, 1981

FLORENCE BAKER 
Box 1074
Clarendon, Texas 79226

W estern Skies - 874 3501 I t 'll Do Motel 874-3471 
Green Belt - 874-9979 Coronado - 874-2087

TENTATIVE SCHEDULE FOR CLARENDON COLLEGE 

EX-STUDENT RE UNION APRIL 25-26, 1981Liv<rn«D*^t,V

SATURDAY. APRIL 25 — 9:00 a.m. Registration — College Cafeteria

Tea and Visitation — Mrs. Brom ley’s

7:00 pan. — A nnual Banquet — College Cafeteria

Broadus Spivey of Austin. Texas w ill be our principal speaker.
„ 'V* <

Hecki"41' J

SUNDAY, APRIL 26 — Special Ex S tudent M ethodist Church Service.
A ttend Church Of Your Choice.

SUNDAY, APRIL 26 — 12:30 NOON — Luncheon — College CafeteriaANNUAL BANQUET 
Saturday, April 25, 1981—7:00 p.m 

Clarendon College Cafeteria Classes To Be Honored This Year A re 1931 and 1956

MASTER OF CEREMONIES-Leonard “ Tex”  Selvidge
Dean of Students 

Gene AldersonINVOCATION 
DINNER 
DINNER MUSIC 
WELCOME & REPORTS

MUSICAL PROGRAM Jennifer B. Scoggln
RECOGNITION OF INDIVIDUALS A HONOR CLASSES OF 
1931 & 1956 TeiSelvIdge
ADDRESS Broadus Spivey

Austin, Texas
ANNOUNCEMENTS Emmett 0. Simmons
BENEDICTION Jack Mo reman

Sundsv, April 26,1981 
PROGRAM

11 a.m.—Ex-Students Church Service— Methodist Church— 
Sunday School at 9:45 a.m.. Church Service to be presented 
b> Dr. E. D. Landreth or ATTEND THE CHURCH OF YOUR 
CHOICE
12:30 p.m.—LUNCHEON, College Cafeteria
MASTER OF CEREMONIES Emmett 0. Simmons
INVOCATION Rev. BUI Watson

First United Methodist Church
LUNCH
W ELCOME-BUSINESS MEETING 
REPORT OF COMMITTEES 
MEMORIALS
SCHOLARSHIP PROGRAM 
ELECTION OF OFFICERS FOR 1982 
BENEDICTION Dr. E.D. Landreth

Englewood, Colorado

41. STAFF Seated Edjtor. Billy Hill Co-EdiUxr. Louise Slwrt Co-Ldii .*,  Bob
. r. U  ft to  n c l t  Roy May, Bill M< Dowell, James M attev, Bill*- W hite, Jatu 

. \  . H J iv t t ,  Sotija Atkin**:., Broadus Spivey, Marilyn H ill, D ia m  I* "
E.O. Simmons

Mrs. Hazel Brandon 
Mrs. Florence Baker

Plan to be here— Next Year—Bring a Friend

Ex-Students Assn 
honors class of 
1931 and 1956

The classes ot 1931 and 1956 are being 
honored by the Ex-students association on 
April 25. 26, 1981. A special invitation is 
extended to all class members:

1956 Sophomores: Atkinson, Sonja Kay; 
Ayres, Burton Dale; Benton, Benjamin Carl; 
Bollinger. Roberta R. (Lindley); Breedlove, 
Wilbur Fate; Briggs. Mary Lynn; Brown, Ray 
D.; Bryan, Earl Wayne; Chudacoff, .Rebecca 
Jean (King); Gampitt, Harold Leroy; Cosper, 
Sherman; Cowan, Jo Ellen (Dingier); Farris. 
Erma Lee; Garton, Bob Joe; Gowdy, Ronnie 
Wayne; Harris, Harold Gene; Hill, Billy Royce; 
Hill, Ella Marilyn; Heathington. Nellie Jon; 
Jordan. Joyce Offret; Jordan, Perry Edward; 
King, A.K.; Kunka, Gary Novan; Landers, Don 
Alvin; Mossey, James; May, Roy Lee; 
McBrayer, Gene; McDowell, Billy L.; Roberts, 
Bobby Sam; Robinson, Donald Gayle; Rool, 
Wanda Joyce (Sibley); Short, Louise; Smith. 
June Angeline (Mosley); Spivey, Broadus 
Autry; Spivey, Ruth Ann (King); Stepps, 
James Carol; Templeton, Dianna; Thomberry, 
Vanetta (MCGellan); Tomlin, Betty Nan; 
Turner. Janet; Wallace, Glen Franklin; and 
Wright, Charles Alvin.

1931 Sophomores were Dillard, Billy; Cham­
berlain, Helen (Goldston); Chiles, Ruth 
(Dunn); Estlack, Eugene; French, Elvis Cole­
man; Gilbert, Hazel Oleta; Hayes. Lorene; 
Lush, Verna; Pope, Lynn (LaFon); Rodney, 
Lucy; Slater. Helen Lucille; and Wood, 
Maurine Edith.

A graduate of the 1956 class, Broadus 
Spivey, Attorney-at-Law, Austin. Texas, will 
be the speaker at the Saturday night banquet.

Anyone having information concerning this 
class, married names, addresses or phone 
numbers please contact; Florence Baker, Box 
1074, Clarendon, TX 79226.

I)* an unit i'r >t. >< >r • . /  If  ’or

R. E. DRENNAft, Dan of 
Clarendon College

LO R R A IN E
P ATR IC K

JULIA DEAN

JEWELL FORDMARY HAZEL 
HURN

GERALDINE
KELLY

FRANCES
CAUTHEN



THE MEDIUM-TORNADO
Fair watch and warning chances
To 400 feet wide
To 10 miles long
Lasts to 20 minutes
Winds 100-150 mph

THE MAXI-TORNADO 
Does most of the killing 
Very good watch and warning chances 
To 1 Vi miles wide 
To 200 miles long 
Lasts to 3 hours

Storm warning signals

Of aJI the winds 
that sweep this 
plain ’s surface,
tornadoes are 
the mostviolent.
THEIR TIME on Earth is short, and their 

destructive paths are rather small. But the 
march of these short-lived, local storms through 

populated areas leaves paths of terrible 
destruction. In seconds, a tornado can trans­
form a thriving street into a ruin, and hope 
into despair.

If we have been placed 
jnder a tornado warning and 
there are threating clouds in 
ir near Clarendon, the siren 
will be sounded TWO 
m o *

If a tornado is sighted by

«tonn watch personnel the 
two blasts win be repealed 
••vesel th e e  and you need 
to take cover.

If there is a power filler, 
police cars and or other 
emergency vehicles will be

used in residential areas.
nememner wnen TWO 

blaata on the siren  is 
gt f tnU-‘ Several Ttasee it is
time to TAKE COVEI 
IMMEDIATELY.

SEVERE LOCAL STORM WARNING SERVICE
/ V \

THE MINI-TORNADO
Poor watch and warning chances
To 100 feet wide
To V2 mile long
Lasts a few minutes
Winds under 100 mph

j . — , , .»  j - T  t  i  t

The I cycle af a

1. 1 * « , 
South Da-

From a thunderstorm

From 1953 through 1976, killer tornadoes occurred in 36 states with the maximum threat area east ot the Conti­
nental Divide. They occurred in every month and during both day and night. The greatest potential tor casualties 
from tornadoes is not necessarily where the greatest number ot tornadoes occur, but where there is a high 
tornado incidence, a dense population, and many mobile homes or poorly constructed wood frame houses 
without basements. Mississippi with only 3.1 percent ot the tornadoes and a moderate population density, has experi­
enced the second greatest percentage (10.8)ot the total tornado-related deaths. Oklahoma’s 7.9 mean annual number 
ot tornadoes per 10,000 square miles (25,900 square kilometers) is the highest.

TORNADOES OCCUR in many parts of the 
world and in all 50States. But no area is 
more favorable to their formation than the 

continental plains and Gulf Coast of the U.S., 
and no season is free of them. Normally, the 
number of tornadoes is at its lowest in the 
United States during December and January, 
and at its peak in May. The months of greatest 
total frequency are April, May, and June.

In February, the center of maximum fre­
quency lies over the central Gulf States. Then, 
during March this center moves eastward to the 
southeast Atlantic States, where tornado 
frequency reaches a peak in April. During May, 
the center of maximum frequency moves to the 
southern plainsStates, and in June, northward 
to the northern plains and Great Lakes area as 
far east as western New York State. The reason 
for this drift is the increasing penetration of 
warm, moist air from the Gulf while contrasting 
cool, dry air still surges in from the north and 
northwest; tornado frequency is greatest where 
these air masses wage their wars. Thus, when 
the Gulf States are substantially “occupied" by 
warm air systems after May, there is no cold

II SO states
air intrusion to speak of, and tornado frequency 
drops. This is the case nationwide after June. 
Fall and winter cooling permits fewer and 
fewer encounters between warm and over­
riding cold systems, and tornado frequency 
returns to its lowest level in midwinter.

The mathematical chance that a specific 
location will be struck by a tornado in any one 
year is quite small. For example, the probability 
of a tornado striking a given point in the area 
most frequently subject to tornadoes is 0.0363, 
or about once in 250 years. In the far western 
States, the probability is close to zero.

But tornadoes have provided many unmathe- 
matical exceptions. Oklahoma City has been 
struck by tornadoes 32 times since 1892. 
Baldwin, Miss., was struck twice by tornadoes 
during a 25-minute period on March 16,1942.
A third of Irving, Kans., was left in ruins by two 
tornadoes which occurred 45 minutes apart on 
May 30,1879. Austin, Tex., had two tornadoes 
in rapid succession on May 4,1922, and Codell, 
Kans., was struck three times, in 1916,1917, 
and 1918— each time on May 20.

m after It
to earth

[2] A 
to f< [behind the windmill

Individual 
Safety Tips
•  When a tornado threatens, your immediate 

taction can save your life!

•  STAY AWAY FROM WINDOWS, DOORS, 
AND OUTSIDE WALLS! PROTECT YOUR 
HEAD!

•  In homes and small buildings, go to the 
basement or to an interior part of the lowest 
level— closets, bathrooms, or interior halls. 
Get under something sturdy.

•  In schools, nursing homes, hospitals, fac­
tories, and shopping centers, go to pre­
designated shelter areas. Interior hallways 
on the lowest floor are usually best.

e In high-rise buildings, go to interior small 
rooms or hallways.

•  In mobile homes or vehicles, leave and 
go to a substantial structure. If there is no 
shelter nearby, lie flat in the nearest ditch, 
ravine, or culvert with your hands shielding 
your head.

(NOTE: The Defense Civil Preparedness Agency has 
several publications on shelters for nuclear blasts and 
fallout protection. Some of these could serve as tornado 
shelters. To request information write DCPA, Washington, 
DC 20301.
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TORNADO W ATCH :Tornadoes and severe thunderstorms are possible.

’ • ‘ , ' # 
TORNADO W ARNING: Tornado detected, take shelter immediately.

LISTEN TO RADIO, TELEVISION, OR NOAA 
WEATHER RADIO for latest National Weather 
Service bulletins.
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Severe local storms are tornadoes, and 
severe thunderstorms which are accom­
panied by very strong winds. (More than 
58 miles per hour—93 kilometers per hour) 
or large hail (%  inch—1.9 centimeters di­
ameter or larger). Heavy rainfall and danger­
ous lightning may also be associated with 
these storms. They are small, short lived 
and the most difficult weather phenomena to 
forecast precisely. Even so, it is possible to 
predict general areas where severe thunder­
storms and tornadoes are most likely to 
occur.

This very important forecasting function 
is performed at the National Severe Storms 
Forecast Center (NSSFC) in Kansas City, 
Missouri. This facility is operated by the 
National Weather Service, a major element of 
NOAA, the National Oceanic and Atmos­
pheric Administration of the U S. Department 
of Commerce. The NSSFC meteorologists 
monitor conditions in the North American 
atmosphere, using surface data from hun­
dreds of locations, radar information, satel­
lite photographs, meteorological upper-air 
profiles (obtained from sounding balloons) 
and reports from pilots. From these thou­
sands of pieces of information, forecasters 
determine the area(s) in which severe local 
storms are most likely to occur. Informa­
tion on the area(s) is then issued to National 
Weather Service offices and to the public in 
the form of a watch bulletin.

The severe thunderstorm watch or tornado 
watch bulletin states approximately where 
and for how long the severe local storm threat 
will exist. It doesn’t mean that severe local 
storms will not occur outside the watch area 
or time frame. The watch is only an indica­
tion of where and when the probabilities are 
highest. Watches are usually issued for areas 
about 140 miles (225 kilometers) wide by 
200 miles (322 kilometers) long. Persons 
near the watch area should also be on the 
lookout for threatening conditions.

When designated forecast offices receive 
the Watch Bulletin, they prepare and issue 
redefining statements which specify the af­
fected area in terms of counties, towns, and 
locally well-known geographic landmarks. 
These statements are disseminated to the 
public by all possible means, and their pri­
mary use is to guide the activities of local 
government, law enforcement agencies, and 
severe local storm reporting networks in 
preparing for severe weather.

Watches are not warnings. A watch means 
severe thunderstorms or tornadoes are pos­
sible. During a watch situation, persons 
should watch for threatening weather and 
listen to NOAA Weather Radio, commercial 
radio, or television for further ir^ormation.

Local National Weather Service offices will 
issue warnings whenever a severe thunder­
storm or tornado has actually been sighted 
and reported in the area or indicated by 
radar. Warnings describe the “downstream" 
area that could be affected. This area is de­
termined from the location, size, direction 
(which can be erratic) and speed of move­
ment of the storm. Since tornadoes and 
severe thunderstorms are not always sighted 
or indicated by radar, warnings may not 
always be given. So persons should be on the 
lookout for the possibility of such storms 
whenever threatening conditions are ap­
proaching. If time permits, before taking 
shelter, notify the police.

When a warning is received, persons close 
to the storm should take cover immediately. 
Persons farther away from the storm should 
be prepared to take cover if threatening con­
ditions are sighted. Even though a mobile 
home is tied down, persons living in them 
should seek substantial shelter elsewhere 
anytime threatening conditions are approach­
ing.

Severe weather statements are prepared 
by local offices of the National Weather Serv­
ice to keep the public and all other interests 
fully informed of all current information on 
severe local storms. Statements are issued 
at least once each hour, and more frequently 
when the severe weather situation is chang­
ing rapidly. In this way, the latest weather 
developments are made available to those 
who need them. T

Remember, severe thunderstorms and 
tornadoes can, and sometimes do, occur

without either a watch or warning being 
issued. This is particularly true of the small­
est of these storms—the mini-tornado. In 
most cases watches and warnings are issued 
for the more dangerous medium- and maxi­
tornadoes. However, it is nearly impossible 
to issue warnings with any reasonable degree 
of accuracy before a tornado is sighted or 
indicated by radar. Research efforts show 
promise for eventual issuance of warnings 
prior to occurrence of the tornadoes.

Tornadoes Are 
QnJyQne of a 
Thunderstxma’s 
Kilter Elements
•  LIGHTNING IS A MAJOR KILLER. Stay 

indoors and away from electrical appliances 
when storms are nearby. If you are caught 
outside, stay away from and lower than high 
or conductive objects.

•  THUNDERSTORM RAINS cause flash floods 
Be careful where you take shelter.

•  WINDS. Very strong straight-line winds can 
cause great damage.

•  LARGE HAIL. A rare killer but very damaging.

LIGHTNING 
SAFETY RULES

If you plan to be outdoors, 
check the latest weather fore­
cast and keep a weather eye on 
the sky. At signs of an impend­
ing storm— towering thunder- 
heads, darkening skies, light­
ning. increasing winds— tune in 
your radio or television for the 
latest weather information.

When a thunderstorm threat­
ens get inside a home, a large 
b jilding, or an all-metal (not 
•onvertible) automobile Do not 
use the telephone except for 
emergencies.

If you are caught outside, do 
not stand underneath a natural 
lightning rod, such as a tall iso­
lated tree or a telephone pole. 
Avoid projecting above the sur­
rounding landscape, for exam­
ple by standing on a hilltop In 
a forest, seek shelter in a low 
area under a thick growth of 
small trees. In open areas, go to 
a low place such as a ravine or 
valley.

Get off or away from open 
water, tractors and other metal

farm equipment, or small metal 
vehicles such as motorcycles, 
bicycles, golf carls Stay away 
from wire fences, clotheslines, 
metal pipes, rails. Put down golf 
clubs. If you are in a group in 
the open, spread out, keeping 
several yards apart

If you are caught out in a 
level field or prairie far from 
shelter, and if you feel your hair 
stand on end, lightning may be 
about to strike you. Drop to your 
knees and bend forward putting 
your hands on your knees. Do 
not lie flat on the ground.

Persons struck by lightning 
receive a severe electrical shock 
and may be burned, but they 
carry no electrical charge and 
can be handled safely. Even 
someone "killed" by lightning 
can be revived by prompt action. 
When a group has been struck, 
the apparently dead should be 
treated first.

The American National Red 
Cross says that if a victim is not 
breathing, first aid should be 
rendered immediately to prevent 
irrevocable damage to the brain. 
Give mouth-to-mouth resuscita­
tion once every five seconds to 
adults and once every three sec­
onds fo infants and small chil­
dren, until medical help arrives
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