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Commission Seeks Crop Disaster Relief
County

met Monday, August 18, in 
the office of County Judge 
Billy Crystal to discuss action 
on county disaster designa­
tion application, tax valua­
tion review and conduct the 
regular business meeting.

The plight of county 
fanners and ranchers follow­
ing the heavy rains of May 
and June was the back­
ground for the commission­

ers action to request disaster 
relief s ta tes  from the 
governor’s office.

Robert Keown from the 
ASCS office presented 
county crop loss figures 
explaining that fanners in 
the Jericho area especially 
were especially hard hit by 
rain, wind and flooding. 
Keown added though that 
farm ers county-wide had 
received varying crop des-
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the heels of die 
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Sunflower Growers 

Watch First Crop
The spreading acreage of 

sunflowers in Donley County 
is one more sign of a 
diversifying agricultural 
base. The condition of the 
crop is generally good but 
local growers are reporting 
infestations of sunflower 
moth larvae which must be 
controlled to anticipate 
normal yields.

Farmers are generally 
withholding judgement until 
more in known about yield, 
insect control and the current 
crop harvest when it begins 
in the county.

Most farmers turned to 
sunflowers this year for the 
first time as experimental 
additions to their crop 
rotations.

Eratic weather this spring 
also altered regular cropping 
patterns and forced some 
farmers to turn to sunflowers 

'as an emergency planting as

rains and flooding destroyed 
cotton and grain sorghum 
plantings.

Growers have reacted 
cautiously as they face new 
disease and insect problems 
in th is first season of 
sunflower production and 
most are breathing easier 
now that many fields are past 
the bloom stage.

Early growth stages are 
subject to attack by the carrot 
beetle which can cause 
serious loss but most fears 
never materialized as infest­
ations were light or never 
materialized.

Pressure from the sun­
flower moth is a potential 
threat though. Unless the 
insect is killed in its larvae 
stage control is very difficult. 
In a dean field of sunflowers 
on the Don Robinson farm 
south of Garendon on the 
Brice Highway, Don dis­
covered some moth infesta-

Hldden crowgun to combat bird

Neighbors
hi grata

Residents on the northeast 
side of Garendon will hear 
what sounds like shotgun 
blasts this summer and early 
fall as bird damage in grain 
increases.

Two mechanical "scare­
crows”  that operate on 
butane tanks are booming 
every two and a half minutes 
in a field of maize owned on 
Wayne Stevens on the 
Charles Morgan farm.

Bothered by crows and 
blackbirds. Stevens purchas­
ed the guns in Oklahoma and 
places them at random sites 
in the field changing the 
position so that the birds do 
not become accustomed to 
their location.

The crow guns are 
manufactured in Holland and 
sold in the United States by 
the B.M. Lawrence Company 
of San Francisco.

Not only do the guns scare 
birds but photographers

walking toward it not 
knowing when the timer will 
click off another blast.

When the picture was 
snapped the gun had just 
fired and thus the barrel end 
view.

Several families have 
complained about the dis­
tracting noise made by the 
gun especially during the 
night time hours. Mrs. Troy 
Moore stated, "The thing 
about drove me crazy for 
three days. We didn’t know 
what the thing was; I thought 
someone was out back 
shooting a shotgun but my 
husband said whoever it was 
would have a broken 
shoulder by now firing that 
many shots. I think they have 
stretched out the intervals 
between blasts now. I know 
bird damage Is always so bad 
down here but the thing Is 
distracting to say the least."

tion. Recent rains may have 
rendered his aerial spraying 
ineffective.

Robinson likes the 
far. He planted the fk 
6 and the heavy June rains 
that demolished his cotton 
failed to get the sunflowers. 
Right now the field is In 
advanced bloom and seeds In 
the center of the head are 
firm in most cases.

Like many other farmers 
who planted sunflowers early 
this year Robinson contract­
ed with Plains Cooperative 
Oil Mill and will deliver his 
crop to a Silverton shipping 
point.

Robinson said contract 
terms seemed to make the 
crop comparable in monetary 
returns to grain sorghum and 
cotton. He believes the crop 
can tolerate a fairly wide 
range of soil fertilities but 
added that fe ftU ify w as 
necessary for adequate 
yields. They seem to stand 
drought conditions well if 
planted early and off to a 
good start.

Sunflower harvesting pre­
sents some new challenges to

Sowers entering production 
r the first time. Combine 

reels used to cut grain 
sorghum are useless for 
sunflowers. Robinson and his 
brother, Dale, may con­
struct one home made.

"You need a solid three 
bat reel on the combine and 
I’m sure you’ll have to open 
the cylinder way up and slow 
the cylinder speed down 
some too," Robinson pointed 
out. And experienced grow­
ers point out that shattering 
can be a problem requiring 
platform attachments called 
seed pans to prevent seed 
loss before the head falls 
onto the header platform.

As sunflowers mature 
some lower leaves will fall off 
naturally. The stalk becomes 
dry and pithy but for 
maximum yield sunflower 
growers have found it 
necessary to go dessicate the 
plant to harvest before 
shattering becomes serious.

Robinson feels that knock­
ing the seed out of the head 
won’t be much of a problem 
but delivering clean seed at 
the required mositure con­
tent may since he’s a first 
year grower like most others 
in the county.

There were no oil standard 
established but Plains Coop­
erative Oil Mill advised that 
the early planted sunflowers 
would be the most desired 
because of the oil content 
value and the special oil 
factors that make the 
sunflower desirable to spe­
cialty food processors.

For local sunflower grow­
ers the crop has been 
relatively easy to grow 
compared to cotton and grain 
sorghum. Don reported only 
three trips over the field 
following plowing; once to 
plant, and rotary hoeing and 
cultivating. The field looked 
remarkable clean; Robinson 
pointed out that the rapid 
growth they make shades out 
some potential weed com­
petitors.

But. like all other crops, 
there are some drawbacks. 
Robinson explained that the 
cost of aerial spraying costs 
in the neighborhood of S12 
an acre and seed expenses 
run close to S3 for the 
imported Rumanian seed 
most Donley County growers
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Volunteer Corps 
Sought For County

Eleanor Sanders, local 
Public Welfare worker, 
wants to enlist a volunteer 
corps of Donley County 
residents who are concerned 
enough to aid the services 
the State Department of 
Welfare cannot provide.

The Care Corps, as it is 
called, seeks to enlist aid to 
help fatherless children, 
aging Texans, blind or 
disabled persons, recruit 
foster parents, help day care 
centers function.

Sanders observed that the 
Care Corps would provide an 
outlet for interests and 
abilities, allow local resi­
dents the chance to express 
their concern for those 
needing help right in the 
community.

Working on a volunteer 
basis Care Corps members

can bridge the gap between 
two groups of society no 
matter how much time they 
had to give. Even a small 
service is very valuable when 
given simply because you 
want to help.

The DPW wants to 
accomplish two goals in 
creating the Care Corps. 
Volunteers can provide 
services and give assistance 
beyond what an often 
overloaded DPW office can 
spare through its own staff. 
Secondly, community en- 
volvement is the essence of 
making the DPW under­
standable and humanized 
within the community.

Eleanor Sanders presented 
the Care Corps story to 
Garendon Lions Gub mem­
bers last week and urged 
those present to acquaint

Know Your Clarendon Business

H enson’s Is  C ar 
And Home C en ter

"I guess if there was one 
phrase to summarize our 
business it would be that 
we’re the ’car and home 
center’ here in Garendon,” 
explains Redell Henson. 
"W e’ve been here on the 
corner for 29 years now 
trying to give local customers 
the kind of service and 
quality products they want 
and doing it with small town 
attention to their needs."

h ’s different running a 
small business in a small 
town as compared to say 
Amarillo. Customers you 

serve must be repeat 
customers and if you treat 
them right they'll be back 
but the opposite is true too. 
So it take special attention to 
make a success here. 
Henson's try to meet that 
special requirement.

Goodyear dealers ever 
since they opened the store 
in 1946 when Redell came 
home from the Army, they 
sell tires for everything from 
bicycles to the largest farm 
tractors in the county. And to 
go the extra effort they make 
tire changes in the field when 
downtime is wasted time at 
critical seasons for farmers.

The store is a family affair

with a second generation 
joining in the business. 
When their son Wes finished 
a business degree at North 
Texas he came back home to 
the family business. Now 
Wes and his wife. Susan who 
is a trained beautician, work 
beside Redell and Frankie to 
make the business a success.

Redell and Frankie also 
have a daughter, Sharon. 
She is married to Mr. Ronald 
Winfrey and they and their 
two children live in Dallas.

The store has become a 
virtual department store in 
those years since opening. 
Frankie’s gift department 
with Fostoria, Franciscan, 
Oneida and other brands of 
distinction draws customers 
from a three-state area aa 
well as her regular Garen­
don area customers.

Frankie pointed out that 
H enson's stock not only 
china, pottery and silverware 
but jewelry and watches and 
they do engraving also.

"W e’ve tried to weed out 
brand names and suppliers 
that were below our demands 
far quality merchandise and 
we've come to emphasize
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The 1975-76 academic year 
starts with pre-registration at 
Garendon College on Mon­
day, August 25.

Students planning on 
attending Garendon College 
this fall can register for 
classes on Monday and 
Tuesday instead of attending 
the regular registration on 
September 2.

Personnel at the oollege 
will be available to advise 
students on curriculum and 
aasist in filling out sche­
dules.

Students who have not 
made a deciaion on attending 
college are invited to visit the 
campus during these two 
days and inquire about the 
opportunities available to 
them in both academic and 
vocational areas.

Regular registration will 
be held from 9:00 a.m. to 
4:00 p.m. on Tuesday, 
September 2nd with classes 
starting on the 3. Students 
may move into dormitories 
after 2:00 p.m. on Monday, 
September 1.

College GED Exam Set

themselves with the program 
and recognize the actual 
need for such services in this 
community.

Need often remains con­
cealed behind family home 
doors and DPW often is the 
only group beyond the family 
or friends that know of needy 
circumstances. Sanders em­
phasized that Care Corps 
was not designed only to aid 
the poor. Human needs 
beyond financial assistance 
were motives for the Care 
Corps.

The elderly, often alone 
without family to sustain 
them could be sided by Care 
Corps Volunteers if nothing 
more than to visit and help 
with needed household 
tasks. The ability to remain 
in their own homes with a 
measure of dignity and 
personal pride could be 
furthered by Care Corps 
volunteers.

“ Someone in this county 
needs your help right now,” 
said Sanders, “ someone 
needs help to make his life 
brighter, more meaningful, 
and perhaps less lonely. 
Volunteer to help him and to 
help yourself by joining the 
Department of Public Wel­
fare Care Corps.”

Loyd W ater, Clarendon 
College Public Relations 
officer announced that the 
G.E.D. (High School Equi­
valency Exam) will be given 
on Wednesday, the 27th of 
August, 1975 at Garendon 
College, Clarendon. The 
tests will begin at 8:00 in 
room 103 in the College 
Administration Building. It 
will take approximately ten 
hours to complete the exam. 
Cost of the exam will be 
$13.00, payable at the time of 
the examination.

Anyone interested in 
taking the tests should 
contact Beryl Ginton, Loyd 
Waters, or Floyd Guinn at 
the college before the 22nd of 
August, 1975. To contact by 
phone, call 874-3571 or you 
may contact the college by 
writing Box 968, Garendon, 
Texas 79226.

Eligibility For Taking 
The Test

The applicant must:
* be a resident of Texas or 

a member of the armed 
forces stationed in Texas

• be at least 17 years of 
age and officially withdrawn 
from school for one calendar 
year (If a 17 year old enters 
the military service, this 
requirement is waived with 
parental consent but the 
certificate of high school 
equivalency will not be 
issued until one year from 
the withdrawal date.)

Ashtoia Sets 
Barbecue Saturday

A chicken barbeque to be 
held Saturday night, August 
23 beginning at 7 p.m. at the 
Ashtoia Community Center.

Those planning to attend 
are requested to leave 
chickens to be cooked for the 
barbeque at Juniors Food 
Market or Gifford's Grocery 
Please don’t bring frozen 
chickens. One half chicken 
should be furnished for each 
person in the family or 
group. Those attending are 
to also bring a basket supper, 
bread, drinks, silver wear 
and glasses.

The cooks are furnishing 
beans.

•  be at least 18 years old 
and officially withdrawn from 
school (Must wait until they 
have been out of school one 
academic year before they 
may receive a certificate of 
High School Equivalency.)

•  17 and 18 ytau olds: A 
letter must be on file at the 
GED Testing Center prior to 
taking the test from an 
administrator of the school 
and examinee last attended 
which identifies the official 
date of withdrawal.

John Payne NM 
Bank Examiner

John Payne, long-time 
Clarendon clothing m er­
chant, has accepted a 
position with the New 
Mexico Banking Commission 
and will leave soon for 
in-service training in Albu­
querque.

Payne recently sold John’s 
Clothing Store to  Tex 
Selvidge and placed the 
family home f 
on West 5th Street.

for sale located

Greenbelt Lake Dep 74.83 
August Rainfall 1.31 
Total for the year 22.84 
August Rainfall Last Year 
2.74.

Stockmen Due Credit
Livestock producers facing 

financial problems due to 
current low market prices 
should take a close look at 
the Emergency Livestock 
Credit Act of 1974.

Just over a year old, the 
Act provides for emergency 
financial help to the producer 
whose business has a good 
chance of success if it can 
survive the current liquidity 
crisis.

"Recent changes have 
been made in the Act that 
make it more palatable to 
both the borrower and 
lender,’ points out Dr. 
Wayne Hayenga, project 
leader in farm management 
for the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

Under the original Act, 
almost 400 Texas lenders 
filled 624 guaranteed loans in 
163 counties as of June 18, 

Total gua 
1,739.2%,

of 5113,364 per loan.
Many cattlemen can use 

this type of financing, and 
the situation will probably 
continue into 1976, contends 
the economist. Therefore, 
the recent changes in the 
Emergency Livestock Credit 
Act should help them protect 
their operations from finan­
cial disaster in the coming 
months.

1975. Total guarantee was 
for 570,739,290, an average

to right, Frankie, RmMI, Wm  and



GYRO 8 4  HAY HARVESTER

Mows lush hay. . .  or cuts 4" brush!! **
Cut, condition, and windrow hay in a 
single pass over the held. The rear axle 
type Gyro 84 —  with Servis’ patented 
Hay Harvester attachment —  success­
fully clean cuts Coastal Bermuda, Su­
dan, and other grasses with densities of 
up to 3 and 4 tons per acre. Does not 
shred. Leaves hay conditioned in loose, 
fluffy windrows . . .  drying in less time 
than normally required.

Now in Stock!

Ask for a Demonstration Today

1I0W 0PEN

r Leila Lake

Fruit Stand 1
Hwy 287

Bast Buys In Frash 
Fruits And Vegetables

F m h

N m . C m i< ■ . .-•> JUFP'.’V

Oysters -  Shrimp - Catfish

Polish Sausage 

Chicken LI wars 
Orka -  Squash -  Cucumbers

A Whele Wheat Fleur 

Frexea Fratt by Special Order
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Editorial Comment "Jefferson’s Dream Come True”
Hermesmeyer
Named
Outstanding

Ashtoi
i called It 

‘A BUI for die More General
Diffusion of Knowledge.'* 
Jefferson and his friend
George Wythe prepared it 
for the Virginia legislature 
and he hoped the passage of 
the bill would give each free
child (the bill excluded girls, 

threeand slaves) 
years of schooling without 
charge.

We have been ever at the 
task of defining what is 
public education since the 
days of the founding of the 
Republic. It is a measure of 
the evolution of our demo­
cratic values that Jefferson’s 

i for education in Virginia 
i now considered supremely 

elitist, whereas in his own 
tim e it was judged so 
excessively philanthropic 
and hopelessly naive that the 
legislature refused to even 
debate it.

plan I
is no'

The definition of public 
education has changed so 
that our country’s education­
al system should more 
properly be called a learning 
society.

Nominated for the Out­
standing Young Women of 
America Award is Jeannine 
Hermesmeyer of San Ange­
lo, according to information 
received from the Board of 
Advisors for the Outstand­
ing Young Women of Amer­
ica Awards Program. Mrs. 
Hermesmeyer is a graduate 
of Clarendon High School 
and Clarendon Junior Col­
lege, and received her B.B.A. 
Degree from Sam Houston 
State University. She has 
taught business and Eng­
lish in the Tarkington and 
Fluvanna Schools

Mr. and Mrs. Clovis 
.! visited Mr. and Mrs. ( 

Bible at Alanreed Tut 
night.

Velma Butler is witl 
Jam es Talberts afte 
extended visit in Amai 

So glad to report 
Ethel Reid of Claude is i 

. real good after her
surgery, 

Niuford Dill’s brother 
and Mrs. Edd Dill

JEANNINE
HERMESMEYER

Bridgeport visited Tui 
and Wed

A member of the Wall 
Young Homemakers she has 
served as president and vice- 
president of the Area 11 As­
sociation of Young Home­
makers of Texas

Jeannine is married to 
Frank Hermesmeyer, Voca­
tional Agricultural teacher 
at Wall. The mother of two 
children, Jacque, 7 and Grey, 
4, she is active in school, 
P.T.A. and other activities. 
Presently she is a  homemak­
er working with the Catholic 
Church, of which her family 
are members.

Sunflowers

But the principles of 
Jefferson’s hope for the 
future are still valid. 
“ Preach, my dear sir, a 
crusade against ignorance, 
establish and improve the 
law for educating^ the 
common people”  Jefferson 
wrote to a friend in 1786.

Clarendon College and the 
college district have tried to 
render that ideal in the real­
ity. It serves as a storehouse 
of information and as a 
forum for continuing educa­
tion for those of the com­
munity willing to avail them­
selves of its services.

Clarendon College iB a mir­
ror of that hope for the com­
mon people. The ideal of uni­
versal education with a 
sense of community is what

community college is all 
about. And with such 
Federal programs as the 
Basic Educational Opportun­
ity Grants, the Nation has in 
fact gone a long way toward 
making a commitment to 
provide a college education 
or its equivalent to every 
qualified young person 
willing to make the effort 
necessary.

M oreover, g rad u a tio n  
from a high school or college 
is no longer seen as the end 
of schooling. Adult education 
in many forms-private and 
public, formal informal, for 
pleasure and for profit- 
nowadays touches the lives 
of nearly half the adult 
population at one time or 
another in this country.

Through this community 
college many people would' 
never otherwise come in 
contact with higher educa­

tion-or learning, there is a 
difference. Retraining for 
new occupations, learning 
for personal accomplish­
ment, achieving some per-

commi
1 goal college at the 
unity level can do this.

The needs of the commun­
ity are the best guide for 
programs of the college. As 
the number of senior citizens 
increase with advanced 
health care the period of 
retirem ent lengthens and 
for many people it requires a 
new series of adjustments. A 
college course in meal 
planning and cooking for 
older adults could serve a 
useful purpose. The college 
has already sponsored 
courses in physical exercise 
for adults and quilting.

We need to rethink what 
college is for. Especially the 
community college. Too

often it has stood for that 
limbo from which it; it was 
neither fish nor fowl. R grew 
from public school districts 
but h was never the image of 
a four-year college or 
university either. But no 
longer does the college cater 
solely to young students; its 
clientele is the community as 
a whole and the needs that 
arise in that community.

Clarendon College, like 
many other two-year institu­
tions operates under “ open 
enrollment” which smooths
the path toward higher 
learning for individualsan
never before considered 
“ college m ateria l.”  Some 
people question that philo­
sophy but it is local proof that 
we vouchsafe the principle of 
universal education for all 
those willing to put forth the 
effort.

(CONT. FROM 
used this year.

The sunflower head moth 
remains the greatest threat 
currently in county fields. 
The insect burrows into the 
back of the head and 
destroys the seed from 
within.

Growers expect yields of 
500-1500 lbs. on dryland with 
adequate fertility and 1500- 
2500 on irrigated although 
few if any Donley County 
farmers irrigated sunflowers 
this vear.

With the recent approval 
of Paraquat as a dessicant by 
the EPA formers can now 
begin applications on fields 
that have readied physio­
logical maturity. But county 
agents warn against prema­
ture applications of the killer 
which will cut yields.

PAGE l)
Robinson feels the cost of 

Paraquat will be higher than 
the cost of use on cotton 
because of the bulk of the 
plant. Two quarts per acre 
may be common as a rate for 
dessicating.

Many fields of late planted 
sunflowers in the county 
were not planted under 
contract and for these 
farmers the fall price will be 
based on open market 
conditions which no one can 
even estimate atsthis point. 
Most farmers will continue to 
produce under contract; 
especially with a crop so new 
to this region of the plains.

For most farmers it is 
wait-and-see as sunflowers 
approach maturity in this 
first year of expanded 
production.

Lions A nnounce C om m ittees
THE CLARENDON PRESS

DONLEY COUNTY LEADER AND CLARENDON NEWS 
s o B sc n m o N  rates

Officers and committees of 
the Clarendon Lions Club 
were announced this week by 
President Jerry  Hawkins. 
Officers and committees 
include: president, Jerry 
Hawkins; first vice-presi­
dent, Darrell Leffew; second 
vice-president, Billy Ray 
Johnston; third vice-presi­
dent, J.D. Little; secretary 
treasurer, Maurice Risley; 
past president, Allen Est- 
lack; lion tamer. Rev. Owen 
McGarity; tail twister, Paul 
Hancock. Directors: Dick 
Delaney, Mac Stavenhagen, 
Lloyd McCord, Rev. Petti­
grew Hamilton and Bill 
Spier.

Committees include:
Program: R.E. Drennan, 

chairman, Clyde 1. Price, 
Delbert Robertson and 
George Stewart.

Membership: Paul Han­
cock, chairman, Homer 
Estlack, J.H. Spier, Jr., Loyd 
Waters and Pettigrew Hamil­
ton.

Attendance: Allen Estlack,

chairman, Maurice Risley, 
Dick Delaney. G.W. Estlack 
and Floyd Guinn.

House and F o o d iJ .D .
■m aidLittle, chairm 

Gooch, Uoyd McCord and 
Billy R. Johnston.

Public Relations: Gene 
Alderson, chairman, Beryl 
Ginton, Billie Christal, Rev. 
James Brandon, Carl AO- 
mond and Lee Jackson.

Boys and Girls Work: 
Jerry Gage, chairman, Dar­
rell Leffew, Glen Day, Jerry 
Courtney and Floyd Guinn.

Sight Conservation and 
Blind: Billy R. Johnston,

chairman, J.G . McAnear, 
Gene Davis, James Duke, 
Rev. James Brandon and Dr. 
Jack Baldwin.

A g r ic u l tu r e :  R o n a ld  
Gooch, chairman, Frank 
White, Jr., Jerry Gage and 
Ernest Kent.

Education A Information: 
Rev. Weldon Rives, chair­
man, P.C. M esaer, Carl 
Morris, Wm. J. Lowe, Loyd 
Waters and Dennis Rattan.

Constitution and By-Laws: 
Carl Allmond, chairman, 
A.R. Henson, Mac Staven­
hagen, Mike Sanders, Frank 
Phelan, Jr.

Gifts and Remembrances: 
P.C. M esser, chairm an, 
Delbert Robertson, L.L.

Donley County, $5.50 plus 28c tax, $5.78 per year 
Outside County, $7.50 plus 38c tax, $7.88 per year

Wednesday witl 
Nuford Dills.

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn 
V o f  Ada, Okla., spent Me 

night with Mr. and 
., Clovis Bible.

Mr. and Mrs. Govis 
• L made a trip to Wellii 

Thursday.
|  Chet Roehr was ref 

from St. Anthony He 
Wednesday to recuperi 

j his home.
Horace Green attent 

Federal Land Bank me 
in Memphis on Wedne 

Mr and Mrs. Bob C 
Higgins spent Thursday 

) Mr. and Mrs. I 
V Mahaffey.

Mr. and Mrs. Hi 
Rhoades, Mr. and Mrs. 
Finley and Mr. and 
Govis Bible were s< 

/  guest in the John I 
home Thursday evenin, 
later attended the S 
Citizens 42 party a' 

) community center in G  
Mr. and Mrs. Billy 

Green of Canyon visite 
H.A. Greens Wedn< 

| enroute home from a t 
A  Corpus Christie and I 

ton.
Mrs. Harold Gre< 

Phillips, Jim and 
, ‘ Mauldin of Electric 

0  visited Tuesday with 
Austin Rhoades at M 

y , Center.
Mrs. Nuford Dill hi 

sister, Mrs. Ben Hid 
Denton visiting in th< 
home.

j > Mrs. Kate Jones 
released from Shar 
General Hospital Me 

. Mrs. H.S. Mahaffey 
' Mrs. Floyd Shannon br 

her to their horn 
Clarendon for a few d 

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn 
of Ada, Okla., went 1 

* Joe Lenords at Alai 
Wednesday.

Wallace and Mac StevenJ  #  . ------ rv r

H enson’s

hagen
Finance: Mac Stevenha- 

gen, chairman, Maurice 
Risley, Lloyd V. Risley, 
Darrell Leffew and Wiley 
Reynolds.

Civic Improvement: Bill 
Spier, chairm an, Jerry  
Courtney, Rev. Pettigrew 
Hamilton, Rev. Gordon 
Oglesby and J.D. little.

Crippled Children: Rev. 
Gordon Oglesby, chairman, 
Dr. Jack Baldwin, Rev. Owen 
McGarity and Carl Morris.

Greeters: Billie Christal, 
chairman, R.E. Drennan, 
Paul Hancock.
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certain brand names like 
Quasar TV’s, Hot point kit­
chen appliances, A-C Delco 
automotive parts, and An*

•» D.Redell points

Clarendon Cattle Company

William M . “ Bill”  Porter 
Office & Res.— [806] 874-3314 

Ranch & Stockyards—  [806] 874-3901

Bonded Order Buying-Registered 
With U .S .D .A . Packer’s & Stockyards

FOR SALE-Good Young Stock Cows 
FOR SALE-Stocker Feeder Cattle

See me before you buy

W ILL BUY-Stocker Feeder Cattle 
[See Me Before You Sell!]

At a loss about what to do with the market 
In Its present condition-?

I will soil you cattle-buy thorn beck for 
later delivery or workout a gain deal for 
you-Why gamble-Lock In a profit!

See mo for any of your cattle needs!
William M  “ Bill”  Porter

chor paints, 
out.

“ We’re a jobber for A-C 
Delco, have been for a long 
time now and we sell both 
retail and wholesale. Alot of 
people don’t know though 
that we give discounts on 
auto parts so you’re more 
than likely able to buy here in 
Clarendon as cheaply as 
elsewhere.”

Henson’s once called 
themselves the A.R. Henson 
Tire Company but as new 
lines of merchandise were 
added or established lines 
expanded the name sounded 
cumbersome so the family 
shortened it to just Henson’s 
because it seemed to convey 
the multi-line nature of their 
store better.

As sales of radios and TV’s 
climbed through the years 
Henson’s have not only sold 
but serviced TV’s, installed 
antennas and tried to offer 
customers the assurance that 
their radio or TV wouldn’t 
become an orphan once they 
took it out of the store. 
Brands like Motorola-Qua­
sar, Sony and others are that 
brand name assurance.

But Henson’s is more than 
applicances and tires and 
hardware. They carry oil 
paints, art supplies, garden-
ng equipm ent, sporting

Hensons and that is as Redell 
said, “We’ve tried to treat 
customers that come into this 
store the same way we’d 
want to be treated  our­
selves.”

And with Wes and his 
wife, Susan, and their two 
children Jeffrey and Suzzette 
a second generation is 
making a way of life from 
■mall town merchandising 
now. Wes, who’s responsi­
bility is primarily appliances, 
radios and TV’s also doubles 
as serviceman when calls for 
repairs or installation come 
in.

For the Henson’s small 
town business rem ains a 
challenge and a satifying way 
of life. For Reded, Frankie, 
Wes and Susan Garendon is 
their kind of town.

PULL-ON PECOS

C M M I
NO LACES!
LARGE SELECTION 

OF SIZES AND WIDTHS

r e p w i n q I ^ I

Try them on at

Jamas Owens

c.

Jumbo Roll

Paper

FORD
W all fo W all Bath

Clearance Sale

equlpr
goods, plumbing supplies, 

1st is impressive for athe list Is impressive 
town the size of Garendon. 
Henson’s Is also James 
Ashcraft and Dorisene Mc­
Anear who’ve been with the 
business for fifteen yews. 
Lawn mower repair to tire 
changes is Ashcraft’s de­
partm ent while Dorisene 
waits on customers in the

Behind the stock of 
merchandise there Is a 
simple belief th a t makes 
everything else worthwhile 
as store owners for the

Palmar Mater Ca.
iv Texas
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Hermeemeyer, Voca 
Agricultural teacher 

all. The mother of two 
ran, Jacque, 7 and Grey, 

is active in school, 
u and other activities, 
itly she is a homemak- 
Iring with the Catholic 

ch, of which her family 
embers.

D
bin son feels the cost of 
just will be higher than 
Dost of use on cotton 
use of the bulk of the 
. Two quarts per acre 
be common as a rate for 
eating.
iny fields of late planted 
lowers in the county 

not planted under 
act and for these 

ers the fall price will be 
on open market 

itkms which no one can 
estimate at .this point, 
farmers will continue to 
uce under contract; 
dally with a crop so new 
lis region of the plains.

most formers it is 
and-see as sunflowers 
oach maturity in this 

year of expanded 
uction.
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Mr. and Mrs. Clovis Bible 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Garry 
Bible at Alanreed Tuesday 
night.

Velma Butler is with the 
Jam es Talberts after an 
extended visit in Amarillo.

So glad to report Mrs. 
Ethel Reid of Claude is doing 
real good after her last 
surgery.

Nuford Dill’s brother, Mr. 
and Mrs. Edd Dill, of 
Bridgeport visited Tuesday 
and Wednesday with the 
Nuford Dills.

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Bolin 
of Ada, Okla., spent Monday 
night with Mr. and Mrs. 
Clovis Bible.

Mr. and Mrs. Clovis Bible 
made a trip to Wellington 
Thursday.

Chet Roehr was released 
from St. Anthony Hospital 
Wednesday to recuperate at 
his home.

Horace Green attended a 
Federal Land Bank meeting 
in Memphis on Wednesday.

Mr and Mrs. Bob Gill of 
Higgins spent Thursday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Mahaffey.

Mr. and Mrs. Hubert 
Rhoades, Mr. and Mrs. Doss 
Finley and Mr. and Mrs. 
Govis Bible were supper 
guest in the John Butler 
home Thursday evening and 
later attended the Senior 
Citizens 42 party at the 
community center in Gaude.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Jack 
Green of Canyon visited the 
H.A. Greens W ednesday 
enroute home from a trip to 
Corpus Christie and Hous­
ton.

Mrs. Harold Green of 
Phillips, Jim and Boyd 
Mauldin of Electric City 
visited Tuesday with Mrs. 
Austin Rhoades at Medical 
Center.

Mrs. Nuford Dill has her 
sister, Mrs. Ben Hicks, of 
Denton visiting in the Dill 
home.

Mrs. Kate Jones was 
released from Shamrock 
General Hospital Monday. 
Mrs. H.S. Mahaffey and 
Mrs. Floyd Shannon brought 
her to their home in 
Garendon for a few days. .

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Bolin 
of Ada, Okla., went to the 
Joe Lenords at Alanreed 
Wednesday.

Loren Rhoades of Amarillo 
visited Clyde Butler in 
Garendon and at Medical 
Center he visited his mother 
Mrs. Austin Rhoades en­
route home he stopped by 
the Hubert Rhoades.

Mrs. Terry Bible Christie 
and Brad of Pam pa came 
Friday to spend the weekend 
with the Govis Bibles.

Wayne Brown of Melissa 
returned to his home on 
Wednesday.

Horace Green visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Green, in canyon on 
Thursday.

Mrs. R.R. Partain visited 
Wednesday afternoon with 
Mrs. Nuford Dill.

Sorry to hear Leo Snody of 
Garendon is a patient at 
Groom Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Bolin 
of Gaude spent Friday night 
with his sister, Mr. and Ms. 
Govis Bible.

Mrs. Anne Green came for 
her children, Morris, Ben 
and M argaret, on Friday 
afternoon. She assisted Mrs. 
Horace Green and Ellen in 
hosting a birthday party 
honoring Rhonda Green. 
Those present were Lori and 
Jason Green, Mrs. Beth 
Payne and Charlotte.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Mahaffey and Hugh spent 
Friday and Saturday in 
Hereford with her mother, 
Mrs. Grace Hester and sister 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Brown- 
low.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Dunn and Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Mauch of Dallas were house 
guest in the Bernie Green 
home from the weekend.

Clovis Bible, Hubert 
Rhoades and Bill Bennett 
attended the farm auction 
sale at the Joe Lenords place 
near Alanreed on Saturday. 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Leonard 
will be living in McLean.

Larry Gray of Dimmltt 
spent the weekend with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Vance 
Gray.

Terry Bible of Pampa 
joined his family at the Clovis 
Bibles Saturday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Dunn, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Mauck of Dallas and Mr. and 
Mrs. Bernie Green had lunch 
with the Horace Greens 
Saturday.

MRS. HUBERT RHOADES

Neil Carter of Fritch 
visited Saturday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Nuford Dill.

Clovis Bible and Terry and 
went fishing at Green belt 
Saturday night they reported 
a good catch.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Dunn, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Mauck of Dallas, Mrs. 
Horace Green, Bernie and 
Ellen attended the gradua­
tion exercises of West Texas 
State College at the Civic 
Center in Amarillo Saturday 
night. Mrs. Katherine preen 
received her Masters in Fine 
Arts. Congratulations.

Mr. and Mrs. J.B. Lane 
attended the Wheeler-Watts 
wedding at the Calvary 
Baptist Church Saturday 
night. This couple will be at 
home in Amarillo.

Our sympathy to the 
family of Ben Davis who 

I away Thursday at his 
iie in Childress.

Miss Jane MidKiff visited 
with Mrs. Horace Green and 
Ellen Saturday morning.

Terry Sparks was a 
in the Horace Green 
Saturday night.

Dana Perdue and Brad 
Ryant of Alamogordo, N.M. 
were guest in the H.S. 
Mahaffey home Saturday 
evening.

Our sympathy to the 
family of Adam Risley who 
passed away Saturday.

Mrs. Dick Roehr, Debbie 
and Montie of Silverton 
visited Sunday morning with 
Mr and Mrs. J.B . Lane 
enroute to the Chet Roehrs 
where they spent the day.

Mrs. Terry Bible went to 
Wellington Sunday morning 
to be at the bed side of her 
grandfather Snelson, who is 
critically ill.

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Bible 
and Paul of Alanreed, Trent 
Bolin and Angelia, and 
Anthony, Christie and Brad 
of Pampa had lunch with the 
Clovis Bibles Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Gary 
Fergeson from J.A. Head- 
quartes visited Saturday 
evening with Mr. and Mrs. 
Cecil Payne.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Green 
attended a reunion of the 
Talley family in Childress 
Saturday night and Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Doss Finley 
visited Sunday afternoon

t
with Mr. and Mrs. Chet 
Roehr and their children.

Mr. and Mrs. Jake Moffett 
attended the funeral services 
for Ben Davis in Childress 
Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. Othel Bolin of Hedley 
visited Sunday afternoon in 
the Clovis Bible home and 
took Christie and Brad home 
with her for a visit.

John Just of Lelia Lake 
visited Mrs. OUie Nelson, 
Mrs. Bonnie Koontz and 
others.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Gillof 
Higgins visited Sunday with 
the Frank Mahaffey.

Mr. and Mrs. Skeet 
Brown, Mr. and Mrs. Hawk 
all of Mobeede, Mr. and 
Mrs. Harvey Lockwood of 
Amarillo, Gary Davis and 
Chris Craft attended the 
Matador Round Up Celebra­
tion in Channing Saturday.

See you at the barbeque 
Saturday night.

Mrs. Paul Schall recently 
returned from a three week 
visit with her siatgf.Df.
Mrs. Bob "
Mo.

Our sympathy to the 
family of Adam Risley, who 
passed away Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. L.A. Watson 
attended the Mitchel Watson 
family reunion at Thompson 
Park in Amarillo Sunday.

Those attending the going 
awav supper for Mr. and 
Mrs. Eldon Lyles Wednes­
day night at the Bob Coles 
were Mr. and Mrs. Bob Cole, 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Land, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Land, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gyde Wilson, Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Lyles, and Julie of 
Groom and Mr. and Mrs. 
L.A. Watson.

Mr. and Mrs. W arren 
Hardin, Margaret Waldrop, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Eldon 
Lyles moved to Childress on 
Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Thomas 
of Childress mixed business 
and visiting in their trip tothe 
the Donald Odoms and the 
L.O. Christies Thursday 
night.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
M attingly, Richard and 
Randy from Morganville, 
Kentucky and Pearl Self 
risked Tuesday and Wed­
nesday with Mr. and Mrs. 
L.O. Christie.

Those visiting the Pete

Easterling family and help­
ing with the Easterling 
auction sale were Fred 
Easterling of Farmington, 
N.M., Mr. and Mrs. Gaude 
Easterling of Pearidge, Ark., 
Mr. and Mrs. Russel 
Wason of Panhandle, Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Gray of 
Pampa.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Shadle 
attended the Keninnger 
family reunion in Plain view 
and her sister, Katie Vogt, 
her son, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Vogt, of Arizona and Bin 
Vogt of Pheonix, Ariz., came 
home with them for a visit.

Mrs. Ann Adkins of 
Kermh risked Thursday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Land.

Mrs. Bob Cole and 
M argaret Waldrop visited 
with Billy Goodman and 
Earnestine Allison at St. 
Anthony’s Hospital in Amar­
illo Tuesday af temoon.
Mr. and Mrs. Steve 
Reynolds, Wayne, Cindy and 
Flossie Reynolds were in 
Amarillo Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Elliott 
of Waco risked the Othel 
Elliotts Friday night.

Shug Noble and Gary, 
Cindy Foster, Kala Robin­
son, Gark Armstrong and 
Tommy Noble of Amarillo 
visited the L.O. Chrisite 
Friday and Saturday.

Linda Hammons of Guthr­
ie spent the weekend with 
her mother, Pearl Self and 
others.

Bryan Tucker of Amarillo 
visited Saturday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Glynn Helton.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenny 
Schull risked his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Schull on 
Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Watson, Regina and Mr. and

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Elliott 
returned from Houston 
where they risked the Taylor 
Watson fomily.

Mr. and Mrs. L.A. Watson 
risked Tuesday night with 
the C.W. Gilcrest family in 
Memphis.

M argaret Waldrop took 
her mother, Mrs. Blanch 
Higgins, to the doctor in 
Groom on Friday. She 
received a good report.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tolbert 
of Pampa visited the Robert 
Tolberts Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. O.L. Chrisite

ef Ida Lon and Richard 
Christie of Big Springs 
risked Saturday with Mr. 
and Mrs. L.O. Christie and 
attended the Easterling

Mrs. Ray Pitman, Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Kidd and girls 
and Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Shadle helped Brad Shadle 
celebrate his fifth birthday 
with a party Wednesday 
night.

Mr. and Mrs. Nolan 
Barrow of Lelia Lake risked 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Glynn Hehon.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Hearn returned home Satur­
day from Texarkana where 
they spent several days with 
their son and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. O.D. Hearn, enroute 
they visited her brother, 
Thad Lyle, in Royce City.

Mrs. Bob Cole accompan­
ied her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. L.A. W atson, to 
Memphis on Thursday where 
they attended funeral ser­
vices for C.W. Gilcrest.

Mrs. Dorthy Sullivan and 
Wayne Reynolds and Mr. 
and Mrs. Orvil Bennett of 
Gyde spent the weekend in 
Dallas and went to Six Flags.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Cole, 
Terry, Shanna and M ar­
garet Waldrop spent Satur­
day in Lubbock with the Bill 
Lesters.

Mrs. Hazel South of 
Lawton, Okla., and Millie 
Land of Hedley spent 
Saturday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Pete Land.

Sorry to hear Mrs. Jack 
Lands mother, Emma Mc­
Calister of Ardmore, Okla., 
is on the sick list at this time.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Schull 
have had their granddaugh­
ter, Shelia Schull, of 
Memphis and Tracy Lee of 
Pampa for a risk.

Those risking Saturday in 
the L.A. Watsons home were 
Mrs.Doris Mills and Adinia 
of Lelia Lake, Mr. and Mrs. 
C.I. Casteel of Amarillo, 
Mrs. Bud White and Tammy 
and Dortha Reynolds.

Bill and Randy Tolbert of 
Amarillo spent Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Tolbert

Mr. and Mrs. Othel Elliott, 
Mr. and Mrs. M.L. Mays and 
Lori, Morjory Rowe; Ethel 
Hewett, Pauline Jones, Terry

Elliott and Jack Fo 
guest in the Otto Elliott home 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Tolbert kept the Jack Tolbert 
children Sunday while Mr 
and Mrs. Tolbert were in 
Childress for the funeral 
services of Ben Davis.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald 
Odom and girls were in 
Lubbock Friday and Satur-

Mr. an<f Mrs. Paul Schull, 
Shelia and Tracy and Mr. 
and Mrs. Kenny Schull 
attended the funeral service 
for Mrs. Schull’s uncle, 
Jerrald Lemons in Colorado, 
City Thursday.

Norma Self left Tuesday 
for home in Chinle, Ariz., 
she teaches second grade in 
the school there.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
McDaniel their son, Alan, 
and daughter, Sallie and 
husband, Bob, of Fort Worth 
visited Saturday morning

wkh the Pete Lands.
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Koontz 

risked Sunday wkh Mr. and 
Mrs. CUT Jones in McLean.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete 
Easterling visited Sunday 
night with Mr. and Mrs. 
Glynn Helton.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Neal 
Shadle have moved to the 
JA Ranch.!.

Mrs. Margaret Waldrop 
and Mrs. Bob Cole attended 
a pink and blue shower 
honoring Mrs. Beth Lester in 
Lubbock Saturday afternoon.

Edd Reynolds brought his 
mother, Etta Reynolds home 
Saturday. She had risked in 
Amarillo several days.

Mrs. Pat Lee of Pampa 
risked her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Schull Saturday. 

They went to Memphis to 
take Shelia home.

Jack Eads, Wesley Mills 
and Larry Watson had coffee 
with the L.A. W atsons 
Monday morning.

Caldwells Take Cruise
Mrs. T.M. Caldwell has 

returned from a two-meek 
trip and cruise through the 
M editerranean. Joining a 
tour group of 280 from 
Houston, led by Dr. Charles 
L. Allen, minister of the First 
United Methodist Church of 
Houston, they flew in a 
chartered 747 to Rome then 
boarded the chartered Greek 
liner, the Apollo, at Naples. 
Before leaving Rome, they 
risked the Sistine Chapel 
and St. Pauls Basilica.

Sailing first to Alexandria, 
Egypt, they went to the great 
Pyramids in Cain and sailed 
on the Nile at sunset. Going 
on to Beirut, Lebanan, they 
went inland to the ancient 
cities of Byhlos and Baal- 
beck. Crossing into Syria, 
they visited Damascus, 
oldest continually inhabked 
city in the world, where the 
conversion of St. Paul 
occurred and events relating 
to k.

They then sailed to Haifa. 
Israel, and were in the Holy 
Land several days, spending 
one night in the beautiful 
Intercontinental Hotel in 
Jerusalem. While in Jeru­

salem, they went to the 
museum, Shrine of the Book, 
where the Dead Sea Scholls 
are held. Being in the Holy 
Land was a most moving 
experience, Mrs. Caldwell 
reported, and one that no 
words could ever describe. 
To climax their stay in the 
Holy Land, Dr. Allen held a 
communion service at the 
Garden of the Tomb.

After leaving the Holy 
Land, the group sailed to the 
Greek Island of Rhodes, 
seeing the magnificent 
Palace of the Grand Master, 
then to Ephesus, Turkey, 
where the seven cities of 
Ephes are being excavated. 
On Patmos Island in Greece, 
they saw the cave of St. 
John, where he wrote the 
Book of Revelation. Sailing 
on to Athens, they saw the 
ancient efty of Corinth and 
the Acropolis. They flew 
home from Athens.

There were so many 
wonderful and facinating 
thing, Giqnerieve reported a 
fabulous trip. Before depart­
ing* she. honored at a 
ffolfrV»yng* luncheon at the 
home of Mrs. Merrill 
Winsett in Amarillo.
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The 11, 1975
Mr. and Mrs. Merlin 

Spencer are the proud 
parents of a daughter, 
Ansley. born July, 31. in 
Kansas C.ity. The Spencer’s 
have another daughter, 
Heather, two years old.

Nina Dale, visited recently 
with her daughter, Dr. and 
Mrs. Harold Bier in Sequin. 
They all visited in San 
Antonio and Corpus Chrisit 
with friends and relatives.

Lelia Lake
By MARY CA8TNER

PUT A  PLUS IN 

YOUR LIFE 
WORSHIP SUNDAY

Tom Beasley and son of 
Hughes Springs visited week 

with his sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Nolie Simmons.

Mr. and Mrs. H.R. King 
visited Tuesday night with 
Mr. and Mrs. Leo Smith.

Mr. and Mrs. D.M. Cook 
accompanied Mr. and MRs. 
Bonnie Mooring to Amarillo 
last Monday evening to visit 
their daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Herman Mooring.

Mr. and Mrs. Norman 
Butts of San Angelo visited 
W ednesday night and 
Thursday with her grandpar­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J.L 
Butler.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Penich 
and Mrs. Violet McNabb of 
Amarillo visited Wednesday 
with Mr. and Mrs. HoUis 
Banister.

Mary Lynne and Andy, of 
San Antonio, visited Tuesday 
and Wednesday of last week 
with his sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
R.D. Castner and Cathy.

Mrs. Earl Shields and 
Keenan visited Wednesday 
until Friday with her mother, 
Mrs. R.E. Jones of Bula. 
Patrice returned home with 
her mother Friday after 
spending two weeks with her 
grandmother.'

Visitors in the Earl Myers 
home last week were, Mrs. 
Ruth Irwin and Mrs. Rosalia 
Dunnigan of Rush Springs, 
Okla. and Mr. and Mrs. J.F. 
Hupp of McLean.

LaVelda Norris of Burk-

burnett arrived Friday morn­
ing to spend the weekend 
with Sheila Smith. Friday 
evening, Sheila and Lavelda 
went to Plainview and 
returned home Sunday. Both 
girls will be students at 
Wayland Baptist College this 
fall.

Dale Durham of Colorado 
Springs spent Saturday night 
with Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Altman.

E.W. Chenault of Canyon 
visited Saturday evening 
with R.D. Castner.

Mrs. L.B. Leathers and 
girls visited relatives and 
friends in Amarillo Friday.

J.B . McDaniel attended 
the horse auction in Amarillo 
Saturday.

Mr. and M rs. HolUs 
Banister received word 
Saturday night that his 
uncle, Keith Reynolds of 
Amarillo, had passed away. 
They went to Amarillo 
Sunday to be with the family. 
We extend our sympathy to 
Mr. and Mrs. Banister.

Mr. and M rs. Roland 
Shields visited Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. J 
McDaniels.

Mr. and Mrs. Nolan 
Barrow visited Sunday with 
his sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Glenn Helton in the Martin 
Community.

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Thomas and boys of Dim mitt 
visited Sunday with hia 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. A.L. 
Thomas.

Larry Wade of Plainview 
visited in the Leo Smith 
home Sunday.

M r. and Mrs. George 
Shields carried their grand­
daughter, Kari, home Satur­
day and spent the weekend 
in Amarillo with their 
children.

Mrs. A.K. King of Fritch 
spent Friday night with with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Hester Shields.

We are glad Edd Mooring 
is home and feeling much 
better after having surgery.

Mr. and Mrs. R.O. Nelson 
J r . visited Sunday in 
Estelline with his mother, 
Mrs. R.O. Nelson.

Mr. and Mrs. F.A. Floyd 
had lunch with the Eddie, 
Floyd family Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. J.L. Butler 
and Mr. and Mrs. Heckle 
Stark visited Charlie Bair- 
field, a patient in the 
Wellington Hospital, Sunday 
evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Altman, 
Mr. and Mrs. David Mays 
and Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Watson and Regina were in 
ldalou Sunday afternoon.

Ed Castner of Howard- 
wick, visited Sunday morn­
ing and had lunch with his 
nephew, Mr. and Mrs. R.D. 
Castner and Cathy.

Mrs. Edna Wilson of Tyler 
is here visiting with her 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Poole.

—

B ronc B uster
By Lin Bromley

Last Friday, 1 registered for school. Yet, after twelve years, 
this time was different from all the others. This time, I was a 
senior. My locker is among those at the first in the hall. My 
friends and I are in our last year at CHS. Melancholy? No, 1 
am looking forward to reaping the rewards that twelve years 
of education has brought. Ecstastic? You bet. Monday was 
the first day of all seniors’ lives. Twelve long, hard years have

RUSSIAN OLIVE PROVIDES lingering food supply to 
birds through w inter m onths w ith its berries i t  re ­
tains long a fte r leaf-drop.

s o il  1
NSERVATION 

SERVICE =
By Monty Sowers

District Conservationist

People who enjoy having 
birds around their homes will 
find a new Soil Conservation 
brochure, ‘‘Invite Birds to. 
Your Home," a big help in 
planning and landscaping for 
birds. o

The brochure, written by 
Olan W. Dillon, Jr., SCS 
biologist, tells the birdlover 
how to satisfy habitat needs 
of nesting and wintering 
birds with trees, shrubs, and
food. It tells how a 
conservation landscape plan
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•  Polyester cord body construction for smooth, comfort­
able ride ...  fiberglass coril belts for squirm-fighting long 
wear.

•  Deep tread that holds firrhly to the road for great mileage.
•  Outstanding wet or dry road traction, handling and cor­

nering control.
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used in the selection of trees 
and shrubs will beautify your 
yard and attract the kinds of 
birds you like.

‘‘A conservation landscape 
plan will guide you in placing 
bird-attracting features near 
a window, patio, or terrace so 
you can observe the many 
varieties of birds that accept 
your inv itation ," Monty 
Sowers, SCS district conser­
vationist at Clarendon states.

Even birdlovers in dense 
residential areas can attract 
birds by providing water for 
drinking and bathing and 
living fences and other 
shrubs for cover. “ A single 

‘ the elderberry, is used 
species of birds and 

dress your yard nine 
months out of the year with 
Hk white flower clusters and 
red-black berries," Sowers 
said.

3' "Invite  Birds to  YOur 
Home’’ will tell you the kind 
of food preferred by different 
kinds of birds, and how you 
can provide for them during 
food-short winter months.

Single copies of "Invite 
Birds to Your H om e," 
Program Aid 1093, are 
available free at Soil 
Conservation Service offices. 
The booklet can alao be 
purchased for 75 cents from 
the Superintendent of Docu­
ments, U.S. Government 
Printing Office, Washington, 
D.C. 20402*

passed. There have been many teachers who have trained us. 
Have we at last accomplished the basic knowledge we have 
had drilled into us for the past twelve years? 1 believe we will 
know the answer to this when we walk across the stage for the 
last time in May to receive that long awaited for sheep akin.

The first day of school came and went very rapidly for 
many. There are several new faces-all of whom are welcome 
here in CHS. There are new teachers and new students, all of 
whom we are proud to have join the ranks of those of us at 
CHS.

There are many in CHS. Reportedly, there are 65 or so who 
we are participating in football. There are without a doubt, 7! 
people in band. We are now the largest band among our 
competition. That’s a good feeling, isn’t it?

Our cheerleaders brought home the honors. We have every 
right to be proud of Mona Robinson, Jan Barbee, Fuzz 
"Fonze” Davis, Christi Cagle, Teresa Jack, and Kim Radney. 
They are the first cheerleaders ever to bring home the "Spirit 
Stick’’ from camp. Their honors include two blues, two reds, 
and one white (not necessarily in that order). All of CHS is 
proud to say, "These are our cheerleaders!"

Tonight, our great Bronchos will scrimage in Fritch. The 
time for the B-team is 5:30. The vanity will play at 6:00. The 
two new coaches-coach Wilson, head coach and Coach 
Crockett, Jhe new assistant coach-along with the regular 
coaching staff welcomes you to come and see our teams 
perform! Go, Brones!

Seen Around—
Hardlcy anybody has changed; but it’s good to see 

everybody again.
To the only married student in CHS (unless someone else is 

secretly married)-Rhonda Owens relinquishes her crown as of 
last year’s graduation to Freda Holland. Get ready, girls, we 
need an heir for next year.

Mona Robinson-too bad you weren’t around to help build 
pyramids in the days of the Egyptians! Any comment, 
cheerleaders?

Don Hillis-What fun is a watermelon roast with all girls?
Walter Riggs-care to explain again to Mrs. Stavenhagen 

about the qualifications of a good student?
Pat Weatherton-is that truly real?
Where is Tami Douthit?
Fuzz Davis-why do the cheerleaders call you the "Fonze"?
Mike and Bubba Newhouse-are ya’ll really ready to marry 

Kim off?
Dina Mays-did you ever get yourself straight on locations of 

classes?
To ail from all the Mighty Seniors-WELCOME! 1! Hehl 

Hehl
There is, at last, one teacher who is graduating with us in 

May. One teacher who, after many years of teaching under 
several different conditions, still cares. Mrs. Todd, are you 
enthusiastic about this year, too?

Cathy Castner-after all, a chair is a chair is a chair.
Will this year include a trip to the basement again?
Wil! Mrs. Grady ever catch up or slow down or whatever 

comes first?»,« (,(n u
Will everyone pass English IV?
Will today’s freshmen ever become tomorrow’s seniors?
Will last year’s juniors ever finish “ Gone With The Wind.”
Wifi Bronc Buster survive one more year? Of course it will!
Until next week-once again,
Adios!
Cutest Couple-Mr. and Mrs. Terry Collins, nee-Debbie 

Robertson. lU

R eligious T houghts
By DR. JAMES BRANDON

It is important that families understand and know the fears 
and frustrations that older people face. Since neither time nor 
culture cultivate meaning for the elderly, it is understandable 
that many older people live with dimmed hope and 
diminished joy. Fears and frustrations are generated by many 
problems:

(1) The need to make a radical change in life style after 
retirement; (2) The haunting fear that reduced income will not 
the self-respect which goes with being needed; (5) Feeling 
ironical situation of being physically healthy but 
psychologically defeated; (4) The loss of productive work and 

a i  Y j  • |  the self-respect which goes with being needed; (5) Feeling
A d a m  K l S l e y  trapped by a house in need of repairs located in a decaying

neighborhood where nearby services are disappearing; (6) A

Rites Held 
Monday

gnawing realization that family members either tolerate or 
ignore them; (7) and the constant wondering about how it will 
all end and what agony must be endured before h ends.

Funeral services for Adam 
Francis Risley, age 89, a 
resident of Donley County 
since 1907, were held at 
10:00 a.m . on Monday, 
August 18, 1975 in Schooler 
- Gordon-Robert son Funeral 
Chapel with Rev. Owen 
McGarity, Minister of the 
First United Presbyterian 
Church, officiating. In ter­
ment was in Citizens 
Cemetery with the arrange­
ments under the direction of 
Schooler - Gordon - Robert­
son Funeral Directors.

Mr. Risley was found 
dead at his home on Saturday 
momitig He was born on 
April 9, 1886 in West Plains, 
Miisoari and married the 
late.Icy Stanford on March 
19, 1905 at Caddo Mills. He 
moved to Donley County 
from Caddo Mills and was a 
retired Stock Farmer. He was 
a member of the Church of 
Christ. Survivors include two 
daughters, Mrs. C.J. Lohoe- 
fer of Clarendon; Mrs. Helen 
McGregor of Lewisville; two 
son*. Maurice Risley and 
Lloyd Risley both of 
Clarendon; one slater, Mrs. 
Lenora Parker of Los 
Angeles, Calif.; eight grand­
children; eight great grand­
children; and two great great 
grandchildren.

Pall Bearers were Charles 
Blackburn, Homer Hardin, 
Roy Blackman, John 
Knorpp, Charlie Hearn, and 
F.O. Hodge.

Read And Use 
The Classifieds

Funeral services for Mias 
Mary Miller, age 82, a 
resident of the Goodnight 
Community in Armstrong 
County since 1905, were held 
at 2:30 p.m . on Friday, 
August 15, 1975, In the 
Goodnight Baptist Church, 
with Rev. O.C. Edwards, 
pastor officiating. Interment 
was in the Goodnight 
Cemetery with the arrange­
ments under the direction of 
Schooler - Gordon - Robert­
son Funeral Directors.

Mist Miller died at 9 a.m. 
on Wedneaday, August 13 in 
the Medical Center Nursing 
Home in Garendon. She was 
born in Wellington on 
January 6, 1893 and moved 
to Armstrong County from

Wellington. She had worked 
in the Goodnight Bank when 
it was in existance. She was a 
member of the Goodnight 
Baptist Church and was a 
member of the Order of The 
Eastern Star when there was 
a Lodge in Goodnight. She 
had a patient in the Nuraing 
Home about 3 years. 
Survivors include one sister, 
Mrs. Lyle Walker of 
Marthabille. Louisans and a 
brother, Joe Miller of 
Goodnight. She is also 
survived by servers) nieces 
and nephews.

Pall Bearers were Sam H. 
Crain, W.M. Crain, Leonard 
Winkcompleck, C.M. Hud­
son, Jr., Uoyd Reid, and 
Davit Burrow.

A

One sensitive person has written that it is not death the 
elderly fear most, but life, perhaps long years of life, under 
impossible conditions.

The Biblical attitude toward the.aging stands in sharp 
contrast to contemporary attitudes. In the Bible, old age is 
promised as a reward for respect toward parents. “ Honor 
your father and mother’’ (this is the first commandment with 
a promise,) “ that it may be well with you and that you may 
live long on the earth" (Eph. 6:2-3).

Throughout the scriptures all people are urged to show 
reverence and respect for the aging: "Hearken to your fathers 
who begot you, and do not despise your mother when she is 
old”  (Prov. 23:22); "Do not rebuke an older man but exhort 
him as you would a father; treat....older women like 
mothers..." (I Tim 5:1-2).

Paul, in his letter to Timothy, challenges children to care 
for the aging and needy in their familfes, to return benefit for 
benefit to parents who have nurtured them when they were 
young” (I Tim 5:4).

In addition to specific biblical references concerning 
respect and care for aging persons, one prevailing truth which 
permeates the scriptures is the sacredness of humap 
personality. Respect for persons should be a vital part of our 
religious experience and should characterize our attitudes 
toward the older members of our society. Respect for old age 
is a human attitude which distinguishes man from beast.

(See Christian Life Style for families, Christian Life 
Commission BGCT, 308 Baptist Bldg. Dallas, Texas.)

Mary Miller Rites Friday
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Plowin' Out\ 
the Corners
Someone told me this; “ If 

nobody knows about all the 
trouble you are in then jou 
don’t live in a small 
town.” ...We all joke about 
our small towns, and every 
town does have its routine 
gossips whether small or 
large. But, when we have 
problems, and we well know 
now this is just now, it is 
these small towns that we 
know so many more of the 
people. It is in these same 
small towns that folks come 
running to help and ask what 
they can do. Maybe there are 
advantages both places but 
as for me we have always 
lived in and appreciated a 
small town...It doesn’t have 
to be just a certain size; just 
so long as it still has that 
good neighborly feeling one 
toward another.

Now and then we read that 
some girl was raped and 
maybe killed with folks 
listening in to her cries for 
help and walking by on all 
sides...It seems so tragic and 
we ask how it could possibly 
happen. They tell us you can 
get into it yourself for 
interfering. Maybe even shot 
right at the scene or 
molested later...T hey say 
folks just learn to keep out of 
other people’s business... 
But...could this happen in 
our small town, with dozens 
knowing about it, and no one 
willing to help, or even call 
the police? Again we ask, 
could this thing happen? We 
just can’t believe that it 
could...

Failure is more often the 
lack of energy than lack of 
capital.

Wouldn’t it be nice if one 
could turn off his worries 
along with the bedroom 
lamp.

Will Rogers once said: 
“ We spend half our time 
trying to find something to 
do with the time we rushed 
through life trying to save.”

Never be too disgruntled 
with your lot, in life, maybe 
God planned it that way so 
that could fit into His plan.”

Author Attends 
Bicentennial 
Meet This Month

by VIRGINIA BROWDER

It was our good fortune to 
attend the Bicentennial 
Conference in San Antonio, 
August 8 and 9 as 
representative from Donley 
and Hall counties. As 1 
recall. Panhandle was the 
only other town from the 
Texas Panhandle represent­
ed there. A large room was 
filled with displays from 
mostly middle and southern 
Texas cities and towns.

The Donley County flag, 
some of the county medal­
lions, the Bicentennial scrap 
book with the photographs 
and architectural drawings 
by “ Butch” Hancock, a copy 
of the program for Saint’s 
Roost Saga, and Donley 
County: Land O’ Promise 
were prominently displayed 
for all to see and ask about. 
While the conclave was more 
a “ show and tell”  gathering 
than a sale, I did sell a 
Donley County medallion.

It was all-together an 
inspirational meeting. Mr. 
Sam Kinch, State Chairman 
of Texas ARBC introduced 
the keynote speaker, the 
Honorable John G. Tower. 
Proceeding that we had been 
properly welcomed by a 
lovely lady, Mayor Lila 
Cockrell of San Antonio. Of 
course. Mrs. Gene Brown- 
rigg, whom many Clarendon 
people met during the Ann 
Armstrong Day in May was 
one of the busiest people at 
the conference, answering 
questions and directing 
seminars.

I came away from the 
meeting thinking how nice it 
would be, if the amphithea­
tre in Ciboli Valley could be 
completed and the Donley 
Countians could continue 
some of the fine Bicentennial 
program begun last spring. It 
is certainly too bad to let 
such a great beginning wind 
down to a dead stop. Please, 
one and all, give this some 
serious thought and let’s see 
if we can’t gather the loose 
ends and go on with some of 
our patriotic plans. Thus, will 
Donley County keep her flag 
flying and be worthy of the 
nation wide publicity accord­
ed her as the first rural 
community receiving Bicen­
tennial status and recogni­
tion.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Bell 
of Lubbock are visiting his 
parents, the Shelby Bell’s 
this week. Robert has 
resigned his position and 

ans to return to college this 
all.

D onley A ccepted 
In to  R ed C ross 
B lood P ro g ram

Donley County has been 
accepted into the Red River 
Red Cross Blood Program 
according to word received 
here this week by Pettigrew 
Hamilton, Chairman o f  the 
Donley County Red Crosy 
Blood Program.

A letter from Mr. Pete 
Upton, Manager of the West 
Texas Division of the Red 
Cross states: It is with 
pleasure I can advise you 
that approval has been given 
for your chapter to cooperate 
with Red River Red Cross 
Blood Program , effective 
October I, 1975. This marks 
the beginning of both a 
challenge and of what we

Robertsons
Family
Reunion

Sunday, August 10 the 
family of Mrs. Joy Roberson 
met at the Ash tola Commun­
ity Center. Those present 
were Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
W hitehdrn of Arlington, 
Mrs. Gladys Town son of Axle 
Mrs. Trena Nell (Joe) Payne 
of Casper, Wyo; Miss Guen 
Jones of Evanston, Wyo.; 
Mrs. Mary Smith of 
Amarillo; Mrs. Yolan Rober­
son of Quitaque; Mr. and 
Mrs. Ruben Hilton of Pampa 
Mrs. Lillian White of 
Quitaque; Miss Minnie Mae 
Roberson of Quitaque; Mrs. 
Clyde Johnson and Shannon 
of Fort Worth;

Mr. and Mrs. Donald R. 
Town son and J.J . of Fort 
Worth; Mrs. Oleta Chenault 
and Mrs. Jewel Chenault 
both of Amarillo; Jan Ayres 
of Bushland; Kim Geavinger 
of Wildorado; Mrs. Maude 
Steward, Maxie and Gordon 
of Albuquerque, N.M.; Mrs. 
Lois Walton of Bushland; 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Town son 
Sharon and John of Houston; 
Mrs. Karen Fontenot and 
Steffney of Arlington; Mr. 
and Mrs. Leon Gibbs, Bryan, 
Neal and Lesley of Dalhart; 

orington 
t, Wyo.;

Mr. and M rs. Buddie 
Jones and Mike of Fort 
Worth; Mrs. Rosalie Rober­
son of Wellington; Mr. and 
M rs. Don Townson and 
Kevin of Fort Worth; Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Roberson of 
Amarillo; Mr. Billy Walton 
Bushland; Mr. Carol Howard 
of Amarillo; Mr. and Mrs. 
Wm. W. Norrid and son Bill 
J r . and granddaughter, 
Linda Lee Lugrin, of 
Houston; Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Norrid of Amarillo; 
Mrs. Wilma Richardson of 
Phillips;

Pam Tubbs of Amarillo; 
Donnie E. Lovelady of 
Bowie; Miss Florence Jones 
of Bellville; Mr. and Mrs. 
B.L. Howard of Amarillo; 
Mr. and Mrs. Duane Howard 
and Craig of Canyon; Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Chenault 
and babys; Mr. and Mrs. 
E.W. Chenault all of Canyon; 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Turner of 
Bellville, Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Townson and Mrs. Barbara 
Bailey and daughter, Marla, 
all of Arlington; Mr. and 
Mrs. Faires Wade and 
Jennifer of Corpus Christie;

Mr. and Mrs. Wilfred Hott 
and Jan of Bryan; Mr. and 
Mrs. Edgar Talley of 
Canyon; Mr. and Mrs. Steve 
Miller and Tomette and 
Terry of Silverton; Mr. and 
Mrs. Olin Norrid of Amarillo;

M rs. Dorthy Sullivan, 
Mrs. Mae Wilkinson, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dee Smith and 
Jerry Hill. Mr. and Mrs. Pat 
Roberson, Todd and Lori all 
of Clarendon; Mr. and Mrs. 
Wildon Lovelady and Rick of 
Garendon; Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Sullivan, Tojuana 
and Jon Roy of Hartley; Mrs. 
Joy Roberson of Garendon.

Thanks to the Ashtola folks 
for the use of their 
community center.

Keith Corington and Ty of 
Evanston, Wyo.

Dl
fa!

Mr. and Mrs. Shelby Bell 
and their children had a 
family reunion recently in 
Colorado.

Accompanied by Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Bell, Mr. and 
Mrs. Shelby C. Bell of 
Lubbock and Jack Bell of 
Garendon, Mr. and Mrs. 
Shelby Bell met Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Bell and 
Stephen Bell of Lake 
Oswego, Oregon in Lake 
City. All family members 
gathered for the first time in 
10 years.

Mrs. Tennie Smith flew to 
Konawa, Oklahoma Friday to 
visit her sister and husband, 
the Pete Harts, for a week.

21, 1975

believe could well be the 
satifying Red Cross

____ ever yet undertaken in
Donley County. With our 

‘ ‘ "1 «o our good

T am enclosing for your 
permanent record, a copy of 
the application form, bearing 
Die requisite approval signa­
tu res, along with your 
excellent community en­
dorsements.”

“ Particiaptioe in a blood 
program necessitates a great 
deal of work on the part of 
many people, month end, 
month out. We know that you 
realize this and that your 
effort will .be a strong one.” 

The acceptance consu- 
mates several months effort 
on the part of many local 
citizens and organizations to 
make the Red Cross blood 
program available to resi­
dents of Donley County. 
Effective October 1, every 
resident of the county and all 
students of Clarendon Col­
lege will be covered by the 
program. This means that 
anyone in the county can 
receive needed blood from 
any hospital and charged the 
Red Cross foe which includes 
the cost of shipping, typing 
and storing with no charge 
made for the Mood itself. Mr. 
Hamilton said that the Red 
Cross foe falls from 15 to 20 
dollars less than that charged 
by private blood banks who 
often require that the blood 
received be replaced. The 
assurance of blood is also 
available to children over 18, 
parents and parents-in-law 
and grandparents and grand­
parents-in-law of county 
residents under certain 
circumstances, 
some hospitals fall into 
non-participating catagory, 
Donley residents need only 
to contact Mr. Hamilton to be 
able to have the needed 
blood transferred  to the 
private bank to replace that 
used.

In order to maintain the 
blood bank program in 
Donley County, a minimum 
of 180 units (pints) of blood a 
year will be required from 
doners. Two blood drives will 
be held during the year with 
90 units needed each time, 
Mr. Hamilton stressed. He 
also pointed out that the fee 
of S23 charged to a recipient 
of the Red Cross blood does 
not cover the entire cost and 
that $180 must be paid by the 
local committee each to 
assure that the county 
continues in the program.

The first bloou drive has 
been scheduled for October 6 
from 12:30 to 5:30 p.m. at 
Garendon College. Specific 
details will be given later.

A meeting of all Red Cross 
Blood Program committee 
chairmen will be held 
Wednesday, August 27, at 3 
p.m. at the Farmers State 
Bank. Job duties will be 
outlined and materials per­
taining to the blood drive will 
be distributed. Committee 
chairman for the blood 
program include the chair­
man and co-chairman; Mrs. 
Bright Newhouse, Profes­
sional Nursing Volunteers; 
and Don Stone, Recruitment. 
A film on “ Recruitment” will 
be shown at the college at 10 
a.m. on September 17 and 
one on “ Volunteers” at 2

Km. the same day (place to 
i announced).
Mr. Hamilton emphasized 

that special appreciation is 
due the Lions Gub; Allen 
Estlack, Co-Chairman of the 
blood program in the county; 
County Judge, Billie Chris- 
tal; Garendon Mayor, H.M. 
Breedlove; Hospital Admin­
istrator, Gerry Knight; Red 
Cross Service to the Military 
Chairman, Lawrence Neece; 
the Clarendon M inisterial 
Alliance and all those who 
wrote letters of support or in 
any way assisted in Donley 
County’s being accepted in 
the blood program.

Cheerleaders Attend School At SMU
G arendon High School were: Outstanding, two by a Garendon squad. Jack, Jan  Barbee, Mona 

Cheerleaders attended superior, one excellent. They Pictured from Left to Robinson, Fuzz Davis, and 
Cheerleader school at SMU were also awarded a prized Right: Kim Radney, Teresa Christi Cagle.
August 11-15. Their ratings Spirit Stick, the first received

Robertson Graduates From Mortuary School

Bill Brigmanns

Visit In Clarendon

Bill Brigmaan, aa em­
ployee of Santa Fe Drilling 
Co., aad his family are

13
h  Vc

Tripoli aad aaost recently 
Iran, where he spent turn
years.

In a telephone interview 
with Mrs. Brigaiana, she 
said Tripoli was the place she 
enjoyed living the most, 
however, they were treated 
well in all countries.

During the years abroad, 
Mrs. Brigmaan bacame 
multi-lingual, learning Ar­
abic and Irani well enough to 

aad sightsee withoutshop and 
problems.

Patrick Robertson, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Delbert 
Robertson of Garendon, was 
one of 106 students to 
graduate from Dallas Insti­
tute of Mortuary Science, 
Dallas, Texas, on Friday 
morning August 15, 1975, in 
commencement exercises 
held at Gaston Avenue 
Baptist Church in Dallas. He 
began his studies September 
9, 1974 and since that time 
has received detailed instruc­

tion in many subjects 
including anatomy, patho­
logy, chemistry and toxico­
logy, psychology, embalm­
ing, business law, mortuary 
law, state law, history of 
funeral service, accounting, 
cosmetology, restorative art, 
mortuary administration, 
public health, and speech.

While a student at Dallas 
Institute, he was named to 
the Dean’s Academic A- 
chievement list for one

• <*2

quarter of the school year by 
maintaining an overall 91 
average with no grade below 
a B.

At the awards banquet 
held Thursday evening, 
August 14, in the Oak Giff 
Chamber of Commerce 
building, he received certifi­
cates of recognition for 
serving the class as Ser- 
geant-At-Arms as well as 
serving as Assistant Editor of 
the Eta Omicron yearbook.

’ I* .  «

Patrick will be making his 
home in Garendon where he 
will join the staff at 
Schooler - Gordon • Robert­
son Funeral Directors.

Persons attending the 
commencement exercises in 
Dallas included Mr. and 
Mrs. Delbert Robertson of 
Garendon; Mr. and Mrs. 
Terry Collins of Hedley; and 
Mrs. Estene Black and 
daughter Edie of Wellington.

Shopping trips to the 
bazaars and shops abroad 
yielded among other things 
rugs. A prayer rug, Persian 
and Bactarian rugs are used 
and enjoyed as floor 
coverings. Although expen­
sive their beauty and 
durability make them popu­
lar and practical.

Mrs. Brigmann regretted 
having to leave Iran and at 
the same time is looking 
forward to being permanent 
residents of the United 
States. After a m onth’s 
vacation the Brigmann’s win 
be residing in Louisana.

Mrs. Brigman is the 
daughter of Mrs. Quata 
Phillips of Clarendn.
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GREEN 
STAMPS 
THURSDAY
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OUR 51 st CUSTOMERS INIS WEEK END WILL 

M i RECEIVE OUR ANNIVERSARY WETS
AFTER WE BECAME 50 last year, we quit i 
THANKS and so wanted to show our appreciation with a i 

our favorite friends and customers. We’B keep 
customer at one of our 3 < _
THANKS...., a $10.00 gift certificate FREE.

octal ANNIVERSARY GIFT to

We’ve been in Garendon a long time-THANKS TO YOU who keep saying you I 
Green’s. Fifty wasn’t the end-JUST THE STARTING, so we are simply one js 
and stin going strong.Drop In this weekend, won’t you.

51st ANNIVERSARY SPECIALS

Ronnie McAnear and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Todd were 
honored in a joint celebration 
Sunday in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. J.G. McAnear. The 
occasion was Ronnie’s birth­
day and Mr. and Mrs. Todd’s 
40th wedditi]

_ and enjoy­
ing being together a mid day 
meal was served to the 
honored guest and to the 
others present for the 
occasion. Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Robinson and Heather from 
Amarillo, Mrs. D.T. Small­
wood. Mrs. Mildred Hen­
drix, Mrs. Ronnie McAnear, 
Todd and Jennifer by the 
host and hostess Mr. and 
Mrs. J.G. McAnear.

^ r o p
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On All Summer Lodias Raudy-lo-W
* Blouses
* Slacks
* Slack Sets
* Dresses
* Pant Dresses
* All Sportswear

(Shop our up .ta in  M u  nudy-to-UM u

GREENE'S
DRY 000D STORE

"The Family Store 
We Have Something For everyone

OeuRtyClethM FOR LESS

.V



The 21, 1975

Willie Johnson’s Hedley by MIKE GRAHAM

The Hedley Senior Citi­
zens Club meet in the lions 
Club building lest Monday 
evening. The meeting wes 
well attended with several
guests from out of town 
present. J.S. Hinds is the 
nresident of the club. The 
next meeting will be an all; 
day meeting with covered 
dish luncheon at noon. Good 
attendance is expected at 
this meeting also.

Miss Debbie Upton of 
Amarillo has been visiting 
the Roy McKees and the 
Oneil Weatherly families this 
week.

Mrs. Maggie Bailey of 
McLean was a Monday 
Hedley visitor. She attended 
the senior Citizen meeting 
that night.

Miss Paula Clendennen 
had a birthday last Wednes­
day. Congratulations.

Virgil McPherson and 
Clifford Johnson returned 
from a fishing trip in South 
Texas Monday. They 
brought back a few fish and 
the motel and recreation 
center did well while they 
were gone. They may want to 
go again.

Congratulations to Miss 
Amy Lemley. Her birthday 
was last Thursday.

Miss Lee Ann Woodard 
and Miss Kelly Woodard 
have returned home. They 
have been visiting in the 
Dalhart area.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Reynolds of Amarillo visited 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Virgil Johnson, recently.

Miss Angela Messer was 
named on the Dean's Honor 
Roll at Abilene Christian 
College. She is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Doyle 
Messer.

Assistant postm aster, 
Mrs. Betty Morgan has been 
taking care of the Hedley 
post office the past week or 
so. Postmaster Mrs. Elva 
Davis is visiting and 
vacationing in Sparta, Term.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Battle 
have been visiting with his 
mother, Mrs. Dannie Bern- 
ardine in Hedley and her 
m other, Mrs. Scott in 
Memphis.

Adrian Youngblood of 
Clarendon visited his moth­
er, Mrs. Letha Youngblood, 
recently.

Floyd Curtis has returned 
to his home in Indio, Calif., 
while there he and" his 
mother, Mrs. Ned Grimsley, 
and Ned visited his sisters, 
Annie Mae and Flora.

Mr. and M rs. Jam es 
Evans have been vacationing 
in Alpine, Ariz.

The Hedley schools open­
ed Monday. Their first 
holiday was last Thursday, 
August 14th. The holiday 
was to allow the teachers to 
attend an in-service training 
meeting at Clarendon.

Orgie Behrens of Claren­
don was a Hedley visitor 
Monday. He attended the 
Senior Citizens Club meeting 
while here.

Mr. and Mrs. Newport of 
Weed, Calif., and Mack and 
Bessie Jean Willis of 
Wellington visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Burt Stone and Mrs. 
Myrtle Kirkpatrick Monday 
and Tuesday of last week.

Among the Hedley folks 
attending the XIT celebration 
Dalhart recently were Mrs. 
Betty Dwight and children, 
Timberlee, Paul and Kirk, S 
Scott Doherty, Jimmy Lowe, 
Leon Couch, Lee and Kelly 
Woodard and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Lowe.

Wednesday nights rainfall 
in downtown Hedley was 1 Vi 
inches.

Mrs. Pauline Blackwell of 
Amarillo visited her mother 
Mrs. J.B. Pickett Wednes­
day and Thursday.

Mrs. Gara Baggett was 
recognized as a good citizen 
of Hedley in the Branigan 
Jewelry advertisement in the 
Hedley Informer. She is a 
native of Hedley and has 
been a booster of this area all 
her life.

Mrs. Bobby Sharpe of 
Amarillo and children visited 
the Jap Shaws and Mfs. 
Celia Lamberaon Tuesday. 
Mrs. Lamberson returned 
home with them.

Mrs. Becky Doss went to 
Amarillo W ednesday. She 
will be working there. Her 
husband will join her later.

Congratulations to Johnny 
Reynolds and Mrs. Kay 
Steele. Both had birthdays 
this Monday.

Mrs. Melba Couch return­
ed home Thursday. She has 
been visiting her son, Bobby 
and family, in Gallup, N.M.

Mrs. Elsie Shaw and Mrs. 
Willie Johnson were in 
Memphis Thursday visiting. 
Mrs. Johnson visited the Bill 
Johnsons while there.

Something over 200 Lions 
and their guests attended the 
annual lions Gub family 
picnic Thursday evening, it 
was a chicken barbeque at 
the Hedley city park. Doyle 
Messer and his crew cooked

and served 248 half chickens. 
It was one of the largest 
crowds in recent yean.

Mr. and M rs. Allen 
Estlack of Clarendon wete 
Hedley visitors Thursday and 
attending the Lions family 
picnic.

Leon and Jesse Freeman 
have been at home the past 
week. i

Mr. and Mrs. Arthel 
Gibson of Pam pa have been 
visiting the Waiter Johnsons. 
Arthel a former cashier in the 
Hedley bank is now cashier 
in the First National Bank at 
Pam pa.

Thursday nights rainfall 
was over Vi inch. This makes 
the total rainfall for Wednes­
day and Thursday over 2 
inches. It was very benefi­
cial.

The Bob Staffords of 
Crowley, have been visiting 
the Jack Staffords and the 
Fred Staffords.

Mr. and Mrs. Shafe 
Weavers of Silverton, and
M rs. Carr of Spur were 
visiting in Hedley Thursdays
and attended the Lions 
Club’s community picnic. 
The Weavers are Mrs. Fred 
Staffords parents and Mrs. 
Carr is Mrs. Bob Stafford’s 
mother.

Mr. and Mrs. Omel Hill of 
Ft. Worth arrived Thursday 
night for a long weekend 
with his mother Mrs. Eva 
Hill.

Mr. and Mrs. Oneil 
Weatherly left Friday for Red 
River, N.M. They spent the 
weekend there with their 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Gary 
W eatherly of Colorado 
Springs, Colo.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wood 
had several of their grand­
children with them the past 
week.

Mildred and Randy Shaw 
visited in Childress and 
Hollis, Okla., last Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
Webster and daughter of 
Littlefield, visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Otis Holland last 
Thursday. Webster is Mrs. 
Holland’s brother. They 
attended the Lions Club 
family picnic while here.

Sam and Flora Sanders 
have had a lot of 
grandchildren with them the 
past week. With school 
starting Monday in most 
places they probably have 
about all gone home.

The Hedley UMY met 
Wednesday evening at the 
youth center. Mrs. Sharon 
Stafford was in charge.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Mithelmon of Fort Worth 
was in Hedley Saturday and 
Sunday visiting Mrs. Myrtle 
Kirkpatrick and others.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles N. 
Johnson of Matador and son, 
Grant, and daughters, Char­
lotte and Cindy spent last 
weekend in Hedley with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gifford Johnson.

Rev. J.W. Rosenberg of 
Pampa was in the pulpit at 
the Hedley United Methodist 
Church for the Sunday 
morning service. Out of town 
visitors Included Mrs. Rosen­
berg of Pampa and Bill
Carson of Borger. The pastor 
of the church, Mrs. Kathy
Pigg, of Garendon will be in 
the pulpit of the Hedley 
Church for next Sundays 
services. She has been 
attending school in Denton 
this summer. It is nice to 
have her back.

We are glad to hear that 
Mrs. Myrtella Deahl in the 
High Plains Baptist Hospital 
in Amarillo is showing 
improvement.

Congratulations to T.E. 
Naylor. He had a birthday 
this Wednesday.

The Hedley school lunch­
room menu for Thursday: 
Frito pie, pinto beans, cole
slaw, corn bread, apricot 
cobbler and milk. Friday:
Western burgers, ketchup, 
french fries, lettuce, onions, 
fruit jello and milk.

Congratulations to Mrs. 
Hazel Darnell. Her birthday
is today.

The Hedley Lions Gub will 
have a business only meeting 
this Thursday evening, 
August 21. The next regular 
meeting of the club will be 
Thursday evening, August 
28. Mrs. Kate Stone and 
Mrs. J.M. Baker will serve 
the meal. A good program is 
in the making. Both 
meetings will be at 8 p.m.

A happy birthday to Mrs. 
Elsie Shaw. Her birthday is
this Friday.

We are going to miss Rev. 
and Mrs. J.J. Terry. They 
are moving to Bovina soon.

Mrs. Virgil McPherson 
was an Amarillo visitor 
Saturday.

Ewell Clendennen was 
released from the Hall
County Hospital in Memphis 

»y. We are glad toSaturday, 
have him back at home and 
glad to hear he Is improving.

Mr. and Mrs. Mack Sims 
have company this week.

Visiting them are Mr. and 
Mrs. Alfred Tims and 
daughter, Janie and her 
friend. They’re all from 
Chickasha, Okla.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Tidwell of Pampa were in 
Hedley last Friday.

A former Hedley resident, 
Mrs. Bonnie Alexander 
Lesley, has just been chosen 
one of the outstanding young 
women of America. Congrat­
ulations. She is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Alexander.

Robert and John Pickett of 
Amarillo spent Sunday with 
Mrs. J.B. Pickett.

Bobby Brown is spending 
a week with his mother in 
Temple.

Bill Carson of Borger was a 
Hedley Sunday visitor.

Mr. and Mrs. Coleman 
Shields of Memphis were in 
Hedley Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Nelson of 
Lelia Lake were Hedley 
visitors Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Chubby 
Brown and son, Les, from 
Amarillo visited the Roy 
Brown family Sunday.

Mrs. Alice Lacy of Quanah 
spent the weekend with Mrs. 
Lucy Bishop and Mrs. Lelia 
Moffitt.

Martha Nell and Junior 
Hill had a lot of company but 
they have all returned home 
and we didn’t get their

The church had their ususal 
good attendance.

A pink and blue shower 
was held for Mrs. Danny 
Monroe in the Hedley Lions 
Den Saturday afternoon. 
Many guests called and were 
served punch and cookies 
froma beautiful refreshment 
table. The table was covered 
with pink and blue cloth 
overlaid with net. The

Mr. and Mrs. Terry Bailey 
were in Fort Worth the past 
week on account of the 
illness of Mrs. Bailey’s 
father.

Mrs. Hazel Land south of 
Lawton, Okla., has been 
visiting her relatives here the 
past week.

Rev. Herdon of Memphis 
was in the pulpit for the 
Sunday services at the 
Hedley First Baptist Church.

Howardwick Partyline
By SHARON MILLS

Good morning! Well 
another week has passed for 
most of us nothing exciting 
happened.

A good covered dish 
supper was enjoyed by many 
who attended the regular 
third Friday get-together of 
How ardw ick re s id e n ts . 
Those whose birthdays in 
August are Albert Moore and 
Mel Mills. We also wish 
them many more. The 
supper is for all residents 
and games are played after 
the meal. So why don’t you 
go the next time.

The Lions Gub dinner and 
meeting is this Saturday, 
August 22nd at 6:00 p.m.

Ann Boling and son, Duke, 
mother, Trannie Smith, 
daughter, Suzanne Bailey 
and grandson, Bryan Bailey 
went to Carlsbad, N.M. over 
the weekend. Duke, Suzanne 
and Bryon went to the 
Caverns, while Ann and her 
mother visited Ann’s aunt, 
Mrs. J.H. Sammons.

Mr. ahd Mrs. Bill 
Littlefield and Mr. and Mrs. 
B.B. Joiner of Garendon 
went to Lake Tezoma. 
Naturally they went fishing 
and did catch a few. , 
They got back in time 
Saturday for a visit with son, 
Duane and Roberta Little­
field who came Saturday and 
left Sunday. The couples 
were gone about four days.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer 
Rakernart and daughters, 
Melinda and Rhonda, of 
Hereford were guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert Moore 
Sunday.

I’m sure it is vfcry quiet at 
the Sariches. Polly’s daugh­
ter, Mrs. Ryder, came 
Sunday and left Tuesday 
taking Lisa and Elsbeth back 
home to Rhode Island. Don’t 
you know the little girls will 
have some big stories to tell 
their friends.

Mr. and Mrs. Alton 
Hendrick were in Amarillo 
Monday.

Mrs. Jim Cor gill was in 
Amarillo on business and to 
see the Corgill’s great

r indson, Jason Ray, who is 
the hospital. Thelma also 

had a last check-up for her 
surgery and was released.

Norma and Will Corgill 
have returned from Mule- 
shoe. They visited Norma’s 
sister-in-law, May Lorance. 
What a good way to visit and 
get in some canning!

Fannie Wilson visited her 
grandson, Dewey Wilson, of) 
Amarillo, Sunday. Dewey is 
to have knee surgery.

Joe and Margaret Wells 
recently returned from a 
ten-day trip to Wyoming. 
They report perfect weather 
all but one day. They caught 
enough trout in Wyoming 
mountains to have a meal for 
three-them selves and a

Larry Doane and Calvin 
Burrow are in East Texas on 
a working holiday this week.

Nnw
Furniture

A lU v U v P r l t M

The Y-Knot Twirlers 
danced August 12 to Freddie 
McKee. Jerry and Kitty 
Asher provided refresh­
ments. Our crowd improved 
as two squares danced.

Sorry to hear about the 
Helms sickness. Speedy 
recovery to all of you.

The Sibleys are square 
dancing in Colorado for two 
weeks.

The guest caller on August 
26 will be Richard Mann.'

Our fall class of lessons is

Airport Improvement 
Okayed By County

flower arrangement was pink 
i. Theahd blue mums, 

hostesses were Mesdames 
Gladys Johnson, Eunice 
Johnson, Flossie Wood, 
Thelma Sheilds, Shirley 
Johnson, Leon Taylor, Jackie 
Ran son, Ora Pearl Farris, 
Velva Gibson, Modeane 
DeBord and Peggy DeBord.

Mrs. Connie DeBord and 
Debbie and Mrs. Barington 
of Amarillo visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Troy Wilson of Lawton 
Okla. during the past 
weekend. Troy is now 
stationed at Ft. Sill.

A happy birthday to Kenny 
Drum. His birthday is this 
Saturday.

Mrs. M.E. Wells is in the 
Highland General Hospital in 
Pampa. Her room number is 
125. She is the wife of the 
late Rev. M.E. Wells, a 
former pastor of the First 
Baptist Church of Hedley.

Hobart Moffit is in South 
Fork, Colo., th is week 
vacationing and fishing.

A happy birthday to 
Jimmy Stewart. His birthday 
is this Monday.

Our postmaster, Mrs. Elva 
Davis was back at work 
Monday. She visited John 
Lee Stephens family at 
Sparta, Tenn., also Nashville 
and other points of interest.

Some progress on the 
cleaning of vacant lots in 
Hedley has been made in the 
last two weeks but much 
more needs to be done.

Steve Adams 
Takes Friona 
Post i

approaching. Talk up a big 
class as we need new dancers

Steve Adams, son of Mr. 
and Ms. Raleigh Adams of 
Garendon, has accepted a 
position with the Friona 
School System where he will 
coach freshman basketball, 
assist with football and teach 
social studies in junior high 
school.

to keep eur club going.
Square dancing is clean, 

wholesome, and fun. The 
community needs to know 
about what we’re doing.... 
Tell them.

County Commissioners 
met in their regularly 
scheduled meeting Monday, 
August 11, and discussed' 
and acted on payment of 

’ bills, improved airport facilit­
ies and voting box changes.

The commissioners agreed 
to provide water to the top of 
the ground at the airport by 
refurbishing the existing well 
at the site.

An order to request Lateral 
Road money from the state in 
the amount of $18,657.65 
was entered. In other action 
an easement was approved 
for the General Telephone 
Company to lay underground 
cable.

Steve attended Garendon 
High School, Garendon Jr. 
College and was a spring 
graduate of West Texas State 
University. He holds a B.S. 
degree with a major in 
physical education and a 
minor in history.

QeaHHy Building

Acteens Attend 
Charm Class 
By Mrs. Brandon

FBC Acteens Junior High 
and High School girls, met 
Thursday afternoon. They 
had a delightful time in a 
Charm Gass by Mrs. James 
Brandon. Plans were made 
for roaring activities this 
year. They had 13 girls 
present.

Monday at 4:00 they had 
their first regular meeting 
with 20 girls present. They 
made plans to adopt two 
grandmothers at the con- 
valesant home. Some of the 
programs on agenda will be 
charm classes, dating dis­
cussions, sewing classes, 
banquets, conventions and 
house parties plus many 
more activities. All junior 
and high school age girls are 
invited to come and join in 
the fun and activities.
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young forestry student, 
whom they met at the 
campgrounds. The real 
reason for the trip was that 
Sinclair, Wyoming was 
celebrating its 50th birthday 
and Margaret went to school 
there (although it was known 
as Parco, when she lived 
there), wanted to go to 
" h e lp ”  them with the 
celebration. “ The celebra­
tion was simply great. The 
Townspeople went all out to 
have a busy time for 
everyone—a barbecue, two 
picnics, square dancing, 
parade, arts and crafts show, 
museum, and oh, so much 
m ore ,"  relates M argaret. 
They also got in a visit with a
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ilso got in a v 
cousin in Colorado Springs, a 
tour of Rocky Mountain
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National Park and a visit with 
friends in Loveland, Color­
ado.

The Mel Mills also had 
guests. Mel’s niece and her 
husband, Myrtle and Leon­
ard Howell, of Bridge City, 
between Port Arthur and 
Orange, Texas stopped by 
for a couple of days on their 
way back home from a trip to 
Albuquerque and the moun­
tains. This was the first trip 
to the Texas Panhandle for 
the, Howells, they seemed to 
really enjoy it.

The Mills were also in 
Amarillo last week, this time 
to get more building 
supplies.

The report from Mooring 
Place is the crappie is good, 
some channel cat are being 
caught and the bass fishing 
is better than it has been.

The lake level is 74.86 and 
the tem perature is 77 
degrees.

As of now there will be no 
one on the Party Line next 
week, but will be the 
following week, so will call 
you then.

Sharon
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A motion by Gene White 
seconded by Olace Hicks was 
approved to give Senior 
Citizens S25.00.

A motion by Jess Finley 
carried to discontinue the 
Skillet, Whitefish and Glen- 
wood voting boxes. Those 
persons voting at these boxes 
would vote in the future at 
Farmers State Bank and 
Trust.

Election judges appointed 
by the commission include: 
Martin, Pete Land; Howard­
wick, Bernice Littlefield; Odd 
fellow Hall, Joan Kidd; Lelia 
Lake, Luther Butler; College 
Building, Nita Shelton; 
Hedley, Myrtle Kirkpatrick.

Seventh and eighth | 
ers suited up for foe 
practice for the first 
Tuesday. Amid the joa
and horseplay the boys 

Di

{ *1

T

about the last 
Cowboys game and 
threw the winning tc 
down pass and who I 
cepted who. On the field 
can emulate a new get 
tion’s heroes and make 
resemble art for awhile

Frist day suit-up is 
usual; misplaced mo 
pieces, broken straps t 
repaired or replaced, 
jerseys, it all takes tim 
the boys wear pads for 
now.

Van Choate, from i 
Garendon, sits down i 
bench as the writer 
questions. “ Are you ta 
pictures for the annu 
When the writer replies 
that he wants some picl 
for the newspaper, the i 
comes instantly, “ Oh, 
want to see us get our bl 
knocked off?’’

All probably know 
their future role in footbi 
Garendon depends on 
they play ball as Junior ! 
team members. Coach 
son and Bromley managi 
eighth graders while cos 
Hall and Crockett look ti 
seventh graders.

Wilson talked about 
Junior High football proj 
and school athletics tx 
leaving the locker rc 
"W e’ve got some ideal 
want to try with these 
but I’m sure we won’t I 
much before the scrimm 
I’ve always worked in sd  
where I had responsibi! 
with Junior High kids, ei 
last year."

"W e need to keep loo 
to the future as we 
football. These kids are 
future! And at this lev 
the sport I find it 
necessary to work cl< 
with other departments 1 
it very necessary to '
closely with other de 

1. Tments in the school, 
are alot of demands on 
kid’s time, band, dassi 
assignments. It’s rougl

Bottoria
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i Junior High Suits Up For Football ! C ham berla in  N ew s !
Seventh and eighth grad­

ers suited up for football 
practice for the first time 
Tuesday. Amid the jostlinsZi

|
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and horseplay the boys 
about the last Dallas 
Cowboys game and who 
threw the winning touch­
down pass and who itner- 
cepted who. On the field they 
can emulate a new genera­
tion’s heroes and make life 
resemble art for awhile.

Frist day suit-up is the 
usual; misplaced mouth­
pieces, broken straps to be 
repaired or replaced, torn 
jerseys, it all takes time as 
the boys wear pads for real 
now.

Van Choate, from rural 
Clarendon, sits down on a 
bench as the writer asks 
questions. “ Are you taking 
pictures for the annual?” 
When the writer replies not 
that he wants some pictures 
for the newspaper, the reply 
comes instantly, “ Oh, you 
want to see us get our blocks 
knocked off?”

All probably know that 
their future role in football at 
Clarendon depends on how 
they play ball as Junior High 
team members. Coach Wil­
son and Bromley manage the 
eighth graders while coaches 
Hall and Crockett look to the 
seventh graders.

Wilson talked about the 
Junior High football program 
and school athletics before 
leaving the locker room. 
“ We’ve got some ideas we 
want to try with these kids 
but I’m sure we won’t know 
much before the scrimmage. 
I’ve always worked in schools 
where I had responsibilities 
with Junior High kids, except 
last year.’’

“ We need to keep looking 
to the future as we play 
football. These kids are the 
future! And at this level of 
the sport 1 find it very 
necessary to work closely 
with other departments 1 find 
it very necessary to work 
closely with other depart­
ments in the school. There 
are alot of demands on the 
kid’s time, band, classroom 
assignments. It’s rough on

Dennis Loretta and Anna 
Harrison were supper guests 
of the Richard Stotts Monday

• f t .

the kids and coaches both.
That’s why we try to 
cooperate with other teach­
ers, but it’s hard to do 
sometimes. Communications 
is so im portant between 
coaches and teachers to keep 
things open and cooperative.

This year about twenty- 
two seventh graders and 
twenty-four eighth graders 
suited up to test their 
abilities. Clarendon Junior 
High plays Valley September 
9 at Valley; starting time 
6:00.

(left to right] Tony Janundlo, Stanley

and Mrs. Neal Lisley 
of Fort Worth visited their 
cousins, Mrs. Ethel Dingier 
and Mrs. Eunice Mann, 
Wednesday evening. They’d 
been visiting their daughter 
in Colorado Springs, Colo.

J.D. and Nelda Jones of 
Dalhart visited their parents, '  
Mr. and Mrs. Hawley 
Harrison and Mr. and Mrs. 
J.D . Jones. Sr., awhile 
Friday afternoon enroute 
home from a business trip.

We had a delightful time 
at the Chamberlain Com­
munity Center Friday night, 
and we had a good crowd.

Mr. and Mrs. Gurvis 
Kennard and Jennifer were 
weekend guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Henry Mann.

We were so sorry to learn 
of the death of Mr. Adam 
Risley. Our sympathy goes to 
them in their loss.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Bogard 
of Bula visited the Roy 
Blackman Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronald 
Mottingly of Morganville, 
Ky. visited her great uncle, 
Mr. and Mrs. L.O. Christi, 
Friday night.

Betty White and Tammy 
visited Tuesday with Mrs. 
Billie Hicks.

Mr. and Mrs. F.R. Fields 
of Groom, Mr. and Mrs. J.T. 
Sykes of Amarillo, Mrs. 
Charles Blackburn, Tammy 
Blackburn, and Steve Wilson 
were Sunday visitors of the 
Frank Hardins.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest 
Barbee went to SMU of 
Dallas to pick up a group of 
the cheerleaders Friday.

Those visiting Mr. and 
Mrs. D.R. Koontz this weeke 
were Mr. and Mrs. Roy Lee 
Helm and family of Lelia 
Lake, Theresa Sheilds, Bryan 
Hill, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Morgan and Jason of 
Amarillo and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Koontz of Ashtola.

Ewayne and Janice Barbee 
spent the weekend in Booker 
with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Norman Fry.

We wish a happy birthday 
to Mrs. G.D. Cross, she’s 80 
years young and mother of 
Mrs. Ruth Lindley.

Those visiting this week­
end with Otto Elliott were 
Mrs. Ethel Hewitt, Mrs. 
Magie Rowe and Mrs. 
Pauline Jones of Clarendon, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Elliott of 
Kemp, Mr. and Mrs. Marva 
Lee Mays and Lori, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Foster, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Brogdon and 
Sherri of Borger, Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Brogdon of 
Amarillo. Mr. and Mrs. W.T. 
Elliott, Shauns and Shane of 
Claude. Mr. and Mrs. Dood 
Cornell and Carol, Mrs. 
Nadine Hastey and Barry 
and Mrs. Jewel Hastey and 
baby of Plainview.

Alford Ivey, Mr. and Mrs. 
T.J. Wylie. Mr. and Ms. Ed 
Wylie of Pam pa, Bill and 
Nancy Hall and children of 
Amarillo, Wayne and Magg­
ie Ivey and children, Travis 
and Shirley Ivey, Morris and 
Janie Ivey and boys enjoyed 
a get toge&er and camp out 
in Palo Duro Canyon and saw 
the play, “Texas.’’

were guests a 
C.R. Shields

Neal Carter of Fritch spent 
the weekend with his 
mother, Mrs. Clara Mae 
Carter. Jay Neal Carter spent 
the weekend in Dumas with 
Red and Louise Carter.

Doug Lowen of Columbia, 
Mo. was out of intensive care 
and improving. We hope 
he’s ride to be home now. 

Mr. and Mrs. Olace Hicks 
i aif Mr. and Mrs. 

Saturday night 
for a Mexican dinner at 
Poncho’s.

Steve and Marjorie Fredric 
and Mitchell, Judy and 
Randy visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Olace Hicks this week.

There was a good 
attendance at the Martin 
Barbecue Friday night. 
Dennis, Loretta and Aims 
Harrison and Ed Berg 
attended.

Ed will be leaving for 
Norway the first of Septem­
ber. Ed is the grandson-in­
law of the Hawley Harri­
son’s. We’ll be missing this 
family from the family 
gatherings.

Mrs. Clara Mae Carter 
visited with Ruth and Nell 
Corbin Sunday afternoon.

We hope Billy Goodinan 
will soon be much better and 
able to be home again.

Sanders Family 
Has Reunion

August 17 the Sanders 
family held a reunion in the 
city park in Clarendon.

Attending were Mrs. 
Elmer Sanders; Mr. and 
Mrs. Hugh Sanders; Mr. 
and Mrs. Milton Sanders; 
Billie Don, Marcus, Joe, 
Brenda and Carrie from 
Happy; Leon Sanders, Odes­
sa; Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Sanders, Sandy and Phillip, 
Afton; Mr. and Mrs. Aubrie 
Sanders, Arlington.

Grandchildren and famil­

ies present include: Leonard 
Sanders and Debbie; Mr. 
and Mrs. Kenneth Sanders, 
Kenna, Merna and Beth 
Denver, Colo.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Sonny Sanders, Richard, 
Tamy and Mickie, Plainview; 
Mr. and Mr*- Richard 
Strickland, Billie Dean and 
Dickie; Mr. and Mrs. David 
Furgeson and Kim, Brown- 
wood.

Friends who called were 
Mr. and Mrs. Homer Bonds, 
Mr. and Mrs. Pink Hahn and 
Buster.

Sappliti Self Service (as
■ te  zniqnT :̂
svarf 1o bo->ldgniioY «umb£

SUPS
b-tw v frohnoT*

CONVENIENCE STORE

YOU SAV 
EVERYTIME!

Shurfresh j  Lb j  for 

O l e O  Quarters $  1 00 

Shurfine

Cam ™ 3 /»|«|
Shurfine

Flour
Shurfresh 10 Count

74-3412

Lb 6 5

Shurfresh

Bacon $15!

Franks 120z 6 9 c

Grade A Large

Shurfine

Cloanor

Bar-B-Q 

Chicken 
Bar-B-Q Riba

l 01 s / M 00
Surfresh

Bologlna 12 0z

Shurfresh

Butter
Gaint Size

Cheer *1"

Nice N Soft

Tissue 4 Rolls

Twin Pk

Burrites

Corn Begs 

« i Hot & Mild

Bath Size

Dial Soap 3/$l°°

Armours

Vienna Sausage sot

1 Lb. Quarters

Jumbo Roll

Pringles
Zee

Towels
Sun Shine

Crockers 3 3 /8  Oz. 29*
15% Oz. Food King

Breen Beans 5  / sl 00
Frozen Shurfresh

Orange Juice 60z 5 ,or $1 °°
Sliced Shurfresh

Strawberries 39*

32 Oz. Size

Stay-Puf

Fabric Softiner 33 0z

Pampers sl 98
Daytime 30 ’s

22 Oz. Liquid, 

Detergent

3 / $l

Shurfine 16 Oz.

Fruit
Cocktail »



The

John Clifford left for 
Roswell and N.M.M.l. in 
New Mexico, August 11, 
where he will attend 
high school this fell. Football 
practice has already begun 
there. Mrs. Fred Cary and 
daughters Paula, Carla and 
Cindy from Leoti, Kansas 
were in Clarendon for a brief 
visit with John before he left 
for school.

M rs. Jerry Courtney 
presented a musical program 
for the Lions Club Tuesday. 
Selections were: “ That’s

Area Church Colle8e
What You Get For Loving 
Me,” "Plaisir D’Amour,"
‘Lady Mary,” “ StewbaU,” 

"Come All Ye Fair And 
Tender M aidens,”  and 
"Don’t Think Twice.”  Mrs. 
Courtney sings and does her 
own accompaniment on the

News

guitar.

I  Fall Courses
I  *Law Enforcement Terminology
I  •  Probation & Patole
I  (Both Tuesday nights)

I  AMARILLO COLLEGE
[C a ll Registrar at Clarendon College for information.!

A watermelon cutting, 
sponsored by the Young 
Peoples Department of the 
Calvary Baptist Church will 
be held Saturday at 6:30 p.m. 
at Greenbeh Lake. All church 
members are invited.

Administration
Changes

Don Stone, Church of 
Christ minister, is offering a 
Survey of Scriptures course 
for the community, from 
Moody Bible Institute of 
Chicago. Cost of the course 
will be $12.00.

Tuesday, September 1, the 
Ladies Bible Class of the 
Church of Christ will resume 
their weekly meetings at 9:45

6IFF0RD NH L X  CO
Floydada, Texas Phone 983-5231 

We have a

Night 983-5367 

e of

Need a slderoll, bat don't want to buy,

We also sell and Install Underground systems 
pivot sprinklers

Programs Available

a.m.

Sunday night Presbyterian 
and Episcopal church mem­
bers met to discuss a 
combined Sunday Church 
School program. Teachers 
were sought and curricular 
material discussed. The full 
program for classes for all 
ages begins Sunday, Sep­
tember 7.

Registrar too. 
Floyd Quin:

Sunday, August 24 a 
District Childrens Literature

Don’t wait for the 
HEARSE (

To Take You To Church 
U N IT ED  P E N T E C O S T A L  
J E S U S  NA M E C H U R C H

ClerMidba, Texas

Workshop will be held in the 
Memphis First United 
Methodist Church. New 
literature for children will be 
discussed. The meeting will 
be held from 2 to 4:30. 
Clarendon is expected to 
have six people from the 
church present.

A church reunion was held 
at the Nazarene Church with 
fifty persons present. Past 
members and friends attend­
ed from Amarillo, Hereford 
and Breckenridge.

Mr. and Mrs. Craig 
Johnson and son, Byron 
of Santa Anna, Calif., visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Keys 
this past week.

Houston Bell is at home 
after being hospitalized in 
Amarillo, with a heart attact. 
He is reported improving at 
this time.

"Seek ye first the Kingdom”
TO -VTi;

CHURCH OF CHOICE 
W.W. Wilson 

Weekly Sunday Services

METHODIST CHURCH
Jefferson & Rosenfeld 

Rev. E.G. Gilbert

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
Hwy. 287 & Jackson 

874-3479
R. W. Sullivan, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School...... ...........10:00 a.m.
Sunday Worship...... ....... 11:00 a.m.
Training Union................ 6:30 p.m.
Evening Worship ............. ,7:30 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service....................7:30 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Bugbee & Third Streets 

874-3833
James Brandon, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School.................. 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship.............11:00 a.m.
Training Union................. 6:30 p.m.
Evening Worship..............7:30 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service..................... 7:30 p.m.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD
5th & McClelland 

874-2195
Wesley Sanders, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School ........ .'........9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship  .........11:00a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship ..7:00 p.m. 

Tuesday
Women’s Missionary Council.1 p.m. 

Wednesday
Night Service.................. 7:30p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Howardwick, Tertis 

874-3762
Frankie Just. Pastor “ 

Sunday
Sunday School..................10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship.............11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship...............6:30 p.m.

Wednesday
Worship........... ............   6:30 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Hedley, Texas 

J. J. Terry, Pastor

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE
3rd & Hawley 

874-2321
Rev. R.A. Noakes 

Sunday
Sunday School........................... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship.............11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship.......................6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service.............................7:30 p.m.

ST. STEVENS BAPTIST CHURCH
Jefferson & Martindale 

Rev. Wilson, Pastor 
Weekly Sunday Services

The pastor is from out of town.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
3rd & Gorst 

Gordon Oglesby 
Sunday

Sunday School.........................10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship.......... 10:55 a.m.
Evening Worship........... 6:00 p.m.

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH
4th & Parks 

874-3428
Owen McGarity, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School......................... 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship..................... 9:00 a.m.
Youth Program ..................6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship...... , .......7:00 p.m.

Tuesday
Bible Study............................... 2:30 p.m.

CHURCH OF CHRIST
4th & Carhart 

874-2495
Don Stone, Minister 

Sunday
Sunday School............... ;..9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship.............10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship..............6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service.................... 8:00 p.m.

ST. JOHN BAPTIST EPISCOPAL
3rd & Parks 

Pettigrew V. Hamilton 
Sunday

Sunday School.................10:00 a.m.
S*™ *?........................11:00 a.m.
Holy Communion lit , 3rd, A 5th 
Sundays.

ST. MARY’S CATHOLIC CHURCH 
McClelland & Montgomery 

Father Carlson
Sunday Morning Mass... 12:15 p.m.
Holy Days.......................5:00 p.m.

Father Carlson of Groom

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
Hedley, Texas

874-3663
Kathryn Pigg, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School......................... 10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship.............11:00 a.m.
Bible Study ...............................6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Youth Service............................7:00 p.m.

United Pentecostal Church
Montgomery & Faker St. 

874-3756
Lawrence Thompson, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School....... 10 a.m.
Morning Worship.. 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship...7:00 p.m. 

Wednesday
Night Service........ 7:30 p.m.

ST. MARK BAPTIST CHURCH
Jefferson & Martindale 

Albert Yarborough, Pastor 
' Weekly Sunday Services

Sunday School........................... 9:45 a.m.
Preaching.................................11:00 a.m.
Night Service.............................8:30 p.m.
Prayer Service........................... 7:30 p.m.
Woman's Mission......................8:00 p.m.

MARTIN BAPTIST CHURCH 
Clarendon, Texas 

Charlie Floyd, Pastor 
Sunday

Sunday School..................10:00 a.m.
Church Service.................11:00 a.m.
Evening Service........................ 7:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service....................7:00 p.m.

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH

5th A Jefferson 
874-3667

Weldon Rives, Pastor 
Sunday

Sunday School .................. 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship.............10:50 p.m.
Youth Program......................... 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship........... ,..7:00 p.m.

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Rosenfeld A Kearney 

Hubert Bromley, Minister

CHURCH OF GOD IN CHRIST
302 N. Jefferson 
C. H. Duncan

DONLEY COUNTY 
MINISTERIAL ALLIANCE
Meets First Wednesday of 

Every Month at 10:00 a.m. in 
Farmer's State Bank 

Hospitality Room

Dream Donut Shop 

J&W Lumber Co.

The Clarendon Press 
Allsup's Food Store 

Claude Thomas Welding Shop

✓  • l .
ft
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Scouts Receive 
Merit Badges

Kenneth Vaughn, Presi­
dent of Clarendon College, 
announced changing duties 
for his staff coming this fall 
at Clarendon College.

Taking control of the 
duties of former Dean of 
Students, Tex Selvidge is 
Loyd Waters. Besides Wat­
e r ’s duties as student 
director he also assumes 
Drom Director functions as 
well as his previous position 
as Public Relations and 
Information Officer.

Waters will also continue 
in his role as Student 
Financial Aids Officer and 
assume the duties of College

Members of Troop 33 held 
a cookout and Court of Honor 
at Greenbelt Lake. Scout­
master Tommie Saye pre­
sented awards to Terry 
Putman, Scout Life Guard; 
Dan Sawyer, Scout Life 
Guard; Chris Ford, Scout 
Life Guard and Rowing; Jon 
Nichols, Fish and Wildlife; 
Kyle Hill, Wilderness Sur­
vival; David Lane, Wil- 
derness Survial and Archery; 
Eddie Bright, Pioneering and 
Fish and Wildlife; Tony 
Nichols, Wilderness Survival 
and First Aid; Ted Sawyer,
Swimming and First Aid;

■MMMrsiM'
and Tenderfoot Rank; Alan
Spencer Swimming

Ipyd Quinn will take on 
added responsibilities serv­
ing as liaison to area public 
schools in out-reach counsel­
ing. Quinn also continues in 
his position as Counseling 
and Guidance Director. He 
will also coordinate informa­
tion of on-campus activities 
to area schools.

Beryl Clinton, Dean of 
Accademic and Vocational 
studies will coordinate on- 
campus programs for public 
events and continue to 
develop new educational 
programs for accademic and 
vocational divisions of the 
college.

Office personnel changes 
follow the move to Childress 
of long time college 
bookkeeper, Mrs. Ruth 
Lyles. Mrs. Joy Skinner will 
assume Mrs. Lyles’ functions 
while Mrs. Susan Shadle will 
begin as secretarial and 
clerical assistant. Mrs. 
Bobby Floyd also continues 
as office secretary and 
student records manager.

Sanders, Fish and Wildlife. 
Gardening and First Class 
Rank; Rick Hayes, Wil­
derness Survial, Athletics 
and Star Rank.

Next Tuesday the Boy 
Scouts will start the canoeing 
and Rowing merit badges. 
Be at the Christian Church at 
6:30.

Newhouse Honored

Bright Newhouse, Claren­
don insurance executive, was 
named to the honorary Texas 
Leaders Round Table for 
1975. Newhouse joins other 
insurance persons who are 
recognized for their achi­
evement in insurance sales 
and for service to policy 
holders. Newhouse, a re­
presentative of the American 
Amicable Insurance Com­
pany, has also been selected 
to previous Round Tables for 
his record in insurance sales.

Hospital News

Mrs. Ernestine Allison is 
recovering from surgery at 
Northwest Hospital in Amar­
illo, room 235.

John Humphries is a 
patient in the Groom 
Hospital. Leo Snoddy has 
been hospitalized in Groom. 
Mrs. L.H. Price is a patient 
in High Plains Baptist 
Hospital, where she is 
expected to under go surgery 
for a broken hip.

Mrs. Ernestine Allison is a 
surgical patient in North 
West . Texas Hospital in
Amarillo.

Baptists Begin
RA Program

trips, and day camps. 
T l ~

New Arrival
Mr. and Mrs. Dwight 

McAnear of Poteau, Qua.,

The Royal Ambassador 
program for boys, grades 
1-6, is in full swing at the 
First Baptist Church for the 
coming school year. The boys 
meet each Wednesday at 
7:30 p.m.

The boys are led by Royal 
Ambassador counselors, Mr. 
Roy Lee Helms, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Ward, and Mr. 
Barry Tyler. These people 
are concerned about helping 
boys to become well-inform­
ed, responsible followers of 
Christ, to have a Christlike 
concern for all people, and to 
learn how the message of 
Christ is carried around the 
world, to work with others in 
sharing Christ, and to teach 
boys the importance of a 
clean body and clean mind.

Activities for the boys 
include wood craft, leather 
craft, Indian artifacts, arch­
ery, tours of Clarendon 
businesses, campouts, in- 
tramurel sports between 
towns, nature trips, field

The Royal Ambassador 
boys organization is sponsor­
ed by the Baptist Church 
Clarendon.

Every boy, grades 1-6 is 
invited to enroll. Enroll by 
attending a meeting at 7:30 
p.m. each Wednesday at the 
First Baptist Church.

are the parents of a baby 
boy, Garrick Olin, born 
August 19 and weighing 8 
pounds and 13 ounces. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Olin Plunkett of 
Sallisaw, Okla. and Mr. and 
Mrs. J.G . McAnear of 
Clarendon, and great grand­
mother, Mrs. D.T. Small­
wood of Clarendon.
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Contact
A N tU N  MOTEL

For Bonded 

Termite & Roach 

Control

by Qualified Firm 
Phone 874-3969

Band Boosters had a get 
acquainted ice cream supper 
Friday evening at the City 
Park. Officers elected at the

CC Sets Art
Heritage
Lectures

Reproductions of Ameri­
ca’s art heritage will be 
shown in a series of lectures 
planned for the Clarendon 
College History Department. 
Lowell Carlson History 
professor at the college 
announced the series Tues­
day when confirmation by 
the National Gallery of Art 
was received.

The National Gallery of 
Art, the nation’s arts and 
craft collection makes avail­
able a limited number of 
lecture series for use by the 
country’s schools, colleges 
and universities. Reproduced 
in slide form the art works 
bring priceless examples of 
American art to audiences 
without access to individual 
and institutional collections.

On campus the series 
begins September 15 with 
Survey of American Paint­
ing; October 20, Crafts of the 
Spanish Southwest; Novem­
ber 17, 18th and 19th 
Century Tools; December 1, 
Early American Crafts.

Carlson indicated that the 
color slide reproductions 
could be shown to interested
public groups with prior 

* thenotice and urged th ose 
persons in terested  in the 
series to feel free to phone 
the college for a presenta­
tion.

As part of the coming 
year’s bicentennial celebra­
tion Carlson wanted to bring 
some samples of our arts and 
crafts heritage on campus 
through the extension pro­
gram of the National Gallery 
of Art.

School
Menu
August 25-29 

Monday

Fish sticks with catsup, 
mashed potatoes, blackeyed 
peas, peanut butter cake, 
homemade bread and milk.

Tuesday

Chicken pot pie, English 
, candied yams, straw- 

shortcake and milk.
peas,
berry

Hot dogs with chili on 
homemade bun, buttered 
com, tossed green salad, ice 
cream and milk.

Thursday

Pinto beans, cole slaw, 
buttered spinach, com bread, 
cookie and milk.

Friday

School boy sandwich, 
lettuce and tomatoes, sliced 
pickles, tater tots, peach pie 
and milk.

Merchants Attend 
Dallas Market

meeting were as follows: 
president, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Stone; Vice-president, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bob Kidd;

Clarendon merchants and 
their salespersons attending 
the clothing market in Dallas 
th is week include Mines 
Ruth Neal and Louise Payne 
from the Tumbleweed; Mr. 
and Mrs. Tex Selvidge, and 
Mrs. Mattie Roberts from 
John’s; and Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommie Saye. The Fall 
showing will continue for 

iree days.

Secretary-Treasurer, Mr. 
and Mrs. Doug Burgess.

L egal N otice
AN ORDINANCE FIXING AND DETERMINING THE 
GENERAL SERVICE RATE TO BE CHARGED FOR SALES 
OF NATURAL GAS TO RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL 
CONSUMERS WITHIN THE CITY LIMITS OF 
CLARENDON, DONLEY COUNTY, TEXAS. AND 
PROVIDIN6 FOR THE MANNER IN WHICH SUCH RATE 
MAY BE CHANGED, ADJUSTED AND AMENDED.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF CLARENDON:

SECTION1. Effective with the first gas bills rendered 
from and after thirty (30) days from the date of final passage 
of this ordinance, the maximum general service rate for sales 
of natural gas rendered to residential and commercial 
consumers within the city limits of Clarendon by Lone Star 
Gas Company, a Texas corporation, its successors and 
assigns, is hereby fixed and determined as follows:

First 1,000 Cu. Ft. or Fraction Thereof S3.1277 Gross; 
$2.8149 Net

Next 3,000 Cu. Ft. at $1.6166 Per Mcf Gross; $1.4549 Per 
Mcf Net.

Next 6,000 Cu. Ft. at $1.5054 Per Mcf Gross; $1 3549 Per 
Mcf Net.

Next 15,000 Cu. Ft. at $1.4388 Per Mcf Gross; $1.2949 Per 
Mcf Net.

Next 75,000 Cu. Ft. at $1.4045 Per Mcf Gross; $1.2649 Per 
Mcf Net.

Over 100,000 Cu. Ft. at $1.3610 Per Mcf Gross; $1.2249 Per 
Mcf Net.

No gas bill will be rendered to any residential or commercial 
consumer served under the above rate not consuming any gas 
during any monthly billing period, except that where 
customer’s only use for gas service is in an outdoor grill 
and/or a fireplace starter, the amount shown for the first 
consumption block shall constitute a minimum monthly bill.

ADJUSTMENTS

The amount of each net monthly bill computed at the 
above-stated rates shall be subject to the following 
adjustments: Plus or minus the amount of any increase or 
decrease, respectively, above or below the SI.0399 per Mcf 
level in the intracompany city gate charge as authorized by 
the Railroad Commission of the State of Texas or other 
regulatory body having jurisdiction for gas delivered to Lone 
Star Gas Company’s distribution system for sale to residential 
and commercial consumers where such changes are caused 
by increases or decreases in the cost of gas purchased by the 
Company; plus an amount equivalent to the proportionate 
part of any new tax, or increased tax, or any other 
governmental imposition, rental, fee or charge (except state, 
county, city and special district ad valorem taxes and taxes on 
net income) levied, assessed or imposed subsequent to July 1, 
1975, upon or allocable to the Company’s distribution 
operations, by any new or amended law, .ordinance or 
contract. Each gross monthly bill shall be adjusted 
proportionately. Company, at its option, may forego the 
application of any adjustment if such adjustment would result 
in an increase in the monthly bill; however, failure of 
Company to apply any adjustment shall not constitute a 
waiver of Company’s right from time to time, or at any time, 
to make any adjustment, in whole or in part, in any 
subsequent current monthly bill that may be applicable to 
such bill.

Net rate shall apply to all bills paid within ten days from 
monthly billing date; gross rate shall be applicable thereafter.

The above rate is applicable to each residential and 
commercial consumer per meter per meter per month or for 
any part of a month for which gas is used at the same location.

In addition to the aforesaid rates, Company shall have the 
right to collect such reasonable charges as are necessary to 
conduct its business and to carry out its reasonable rules and 
regulations in effect.

SECTION 2. The rate set forth in Section 1 may be changed 
and amended by either the City or Company furnishing gas 
in the manner provided by law. Service hereunder is subject 
to the orders of regulatory bodies having jurisdiction, and td 
the Company’s Rules and Regulations currently on file in the 
Company’s office.

SECTION 3. It is hereby found and determined that the 
meeting at which this ordinance was passed was open to the 
public, as required by Texas law, and that advance public 
notice of the time, place and purpose of said meeting was 
given.

PASSED AND APPROVED on this the 5th day of August, 
A.D. 1975.

Walter B. Knorpp 
Secretary

H .M . B re e d lo v e
Mayor

City of Clarendon, Texas

STATE OF TEXAS 
COUNTY OF DONLEY

I, Walter B. Knorpp, Secretary of the City of Garendon, 
Donley County, Texas, hereby certify that the above and 
forgoing is a true and correct copy of an ordinance passed by 
the City Council on first reading on the 5th day of August, 
1975, and was passed by the City Council.

WITNESS MY HAND AND SEA 
day of August, A.D. 1975.

SEAL OF CITY, this the 5th

Walter B. Knorpp 
Secretary 

City of Garendon, Texas
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Estate 820 Soutl
874-2533.

29TPC
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FOR S A U

FOR SALEi 1957 Chevrolet 
camper bus. Sleeps four.
Butane ice box and stove.
Good condition. Phone 856- 
3728, Hedley.
___________________ 23-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom house 
with double garage and 
cellar. 619 Gorst Street. Call 
874-3472
___________________ 23-tfc

FOR SALE: 1974 -  550 
Four Honda. Low mileage.
Show room condition. Rea­
sonably priced. Call 874- 
2355. Blackie Johnson.
25-tfc

FOR SALEs By Owner My 
home in Garendon, Texas, 2 
story brick, excellent con­
dition, 4600 sq. ft. living 
area. 3 car garage, 5 
bedrooms, 4 baths, huge 
den, basem ent, beautiful 
landscaping, water well.
$65,000 call John Payne P,m- 
874-2456.

FOR SALE* One Commercial 
lot with 1200 sq. ft. building, 
2 carpeted offices, res room, 
refrigerated air 
and shop area with over I

contact 874-: 
p.m.

highway 287 East 
74-2642 iafter 6:30 

29-4tp

ad If I

FOR SALEi 2-bed room 
house and four lots by owner. 
Hedley. Phone 874-2668.

____  2

SACRIFICES One-Half Sim- 
mental Bulls, Sons of 
Florian. 35 cents per pound. 
CaU Doyle Littlefield 874-
2569.
___________________ 31-4tc
FOR SALE: Lincoln 225 
Amp ARC welder with hood 
and rods. Call 874-2558 or 
874-3635.

31tp
FOR RENT

TV Sets For Rent. Inquire a t 
Henson’s.

_______ 3-tfc

Far Rents Duplex Apartment 
Clean, stove and refrigerator 
furnished. Contact Jack 
Gifford.
___________________ 28-tfc

FOR RENTi Unfurnished 
3-bedroom house and garage 
874-2324 or 874-3493 after 5

29-tfc

FOR SALEi adorable, AKC 
registered, apricot poodle— 
reasonable. Call 874-2019. 
___________________ 30-2tc
PRINTING. Letterheads, 
Envelopes, Wedding and 
Shower invitations, nap­
kins. All color ink. Claren­
don Office Supply A Print­
ing. 104 S. Kearney — Ph. 
$74-2043._________ _

FOR SALEi 750 Acres of 
Land, Half Grass and Half 
Crop, Good Allotments Call 
874-2208.

312tc

FOR SALEi Air Conditioned 
A-Frane 2 bedroom cabin at 
Greenbelt Lake. Completely 
furnished. Reasonable. Call 
Fred Davis, 806-355-3913.

31-2tp

FOR SALEi 1955 Ford F800 
3V4 ton. New engine and 
transm ission. Air brakes 
$800.00 Call 874-2618.
31-ltp

Grain Feed Beef 
Half or Whole 

Satisfaction guaranteed 
Cut and Wrapped 

Ted Shaller 
874-2471

28-TFC

OFFICE SUPPLIES AND 
OFFICE FURNITURE. Of­
fice Furniture, Desks, 
Chairs, Filing Cabinets, 
Book Cases, etc Clarendon 
Office Supply A Printing.

FOR SALEi 19 foot pontoon 
boat, 40 horse Mercury 
motor, in excellent condition, 
with trailer to go. Call James 
Brandon 874-3833 days or 
874-3926 after 6 p.m. 
__________________ 29-tfc

LIKE NEW piano small 
monthly payments. For 
further information call 
collect 669-3121.

31-ltc

FOR SALEi good 2-bedrooiT 
house to be moved.

R.L. Salmon 
510 Budbee 

874-2664 
30-3tp

Bain, 874-2

FOR RENTi Modern two bed 
room duplex apartm ent. 
Call Bob Bell 874-3915 or 
874-2576. .
________________ 25-tfc

in Memphis.
----------B ifc .

Cl Printing Calculators, 
Remington Adding Ma­
chines, Smith-Corona Type­
writers, Also Used Typewri­
ters A Adding Machines and 
Rental Service Clarendon 
Office Supply A Printing.

Fencing...4,5,6 foot chain 
link. M aterials only, or 
installed. Call or write for 
estimates. 806-259-2742, 
P.O. Box 67, Memphis, 
Texas 79245. 102 Boykin 
Drive.

16-tfc

H ELP W A N T E D

Exporioncod In Qroeorlot 
Apply For Managomont 

For Now Gibson Grocary Dept. 
Contact

James Stubblefield 
SEmrrs • ChMioss

817-937-2518

THE CLARENDON CONSOLIDATED INDEPENDENT 
SCHOOL DISTRICT BOARD OF TRUSTEES WILL HOLD 

A BUDGET HEARING ON AUGUST 14.1975 at 8:30 p.m. 

IN THE ADMINISTRATION BUILDING.

New Car

K e p s ira iK H is

A

FOR RENTi 2 bedroom 
furnished house. 874-3818 
Sybil Rattan.

31-ltc

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
house, fully carpeted, 3 miles 
from town on pavement. 
Farm road 3257 874-2157.

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
house, fully carpeted, 3 miles 
from town on pavement. 
Farm road 3257 874-2157.

31-ltc

FOR RENT or SALE: 3l 
mobile homes, one space for 
rent. Call 874-2583. 
___________________ 30-3tc
FOR RENT: furnished apart­
ments, bills paid. Call James

-2332.
30-2tc

SAVE Big! Clean rugs ana 
upholstery with Blue Lustre. 
Rent electric shsmpooer SI. 
Goodmans Furniture.

NUR8ES WANTED 
IMMEDIATELY:

One Registered Nurse for 
relief on 3-11 and 11-7 shift. 
Salary range $40.00 to $42.50

r r  shift. One Nurse Aide for 
11 shift and two Nurse 

Aides 11-7 shift. Salary 
$19.20 per shift. Work four 
days, off two. Sick leave, 
paid vacation, six holidays. 
Good working conditions and 
we believe we can make 
working for us interesting. 
Contact Mrs. Betty Wells, 
Director of Nursing or J. M. 
B rooks, A d m in is tra to r. 
Groom Memorial Hospital, 
Groom, Texas Phone 806- 
248-2411.

MATURE PERSON FOR
maintenance engineer posi­
tion with general knowledge 
of air conditioning, electric 
etc. To relocate to Childress. 
Apply in person or call Mr. 
Merworth at Childress Gen­
eral Hospital 817-937-2575.

31-3tc

C O N N I E 'S  
R A D IO  &  T V  

R E P A IR
Phone 874-3752

Our business Is
efficient car service. We

tires. We keep ye 
abeut the cendltleu ef 
potential trouble spots, 
where neglect can be

CORNELL TEXACO 
SERVICE STATION 

303 W. 2nd. 874-3441

The Equalization Board for 
D onley County H ospital 
district will hold an open 
meeting Friday, August 15th 
from 1 p.m. to 5 p.m.

INSURANCE^ , ^  w o rk lW ,
FOR YOUR compensation insurance 

when I hire an employee 
for farm and ranch work?HOME

RANCH

FARM
For help with insurance 
questions and needs call. .

AUTO TEXAS FARM BUREAU 
INSURANCE COMPANIESCROPS

LIFE 874-2471

Taya A  Gifts. Work 
December. FREE 
Kit. No experience 
Call or write Santa’a 
Avon, Conn. 06001. 
(203) 673-3455. Also 
Parties.”

now thru 
Sample 
needed. 
Parties, 

Phone 1 
Booking

»-8tc

FOB SALEi 120 acres of 
land. Near pavement, fen­
ced, new windmil. Sanders 
Estate 820 South Allen 
874-2533.

29TFC

“ CONFIDENTIAL Care for

Q nant unwed mothers.
A GLADENY HOME, 

2306 Hemphill, Fort Worth. 
Texas. Toll free num ber 
1-800-792-1104.”  
___________________ 4-tfcs

CARPORT SALEi 9 A.M. - S 
P.M. Friday and Saturday 
619 E. Browning.

31-ltc

W hy Is It- A  Man Wakes Up In The 
M orning After Sleeping U nder An 
Advertised Blanket On An Advertised 
Mattress And Pulls Off Advertised 
Pajamas. Takes A  Bath In An 
Advertised T u b , Shaves W ith  An 
Advertised Razor, Washes With An 
Advertised Soap, Puts On Advertised 
Clothes, Sits Down To Breakfast Of 
Advertised Coffee, Puts On An 
Advertised Hat, Rides To His Office In 
An Advertised Car, Writes With An 
Advertised Pencil...Then, He Refuses 
To  Advertise, Says Advertising Doesn’t 
Pay, And Then, If A  Business Isn’t Good 
Enough To  Advertise...He Advertises 11 
For Sale.

RAY APPLIANCE SERVICE
General Electric Franchise Dealer 

Heating and A ir Conditioning 
W e service all makes of A ir Conditioning 

Froozor and Rofrigoratlon 
Service & Repairs 
D.P. R AY, ownet 

Clarendon, Texas 874-3801

FROMA
LOCAL INDEPENDENT AGENT 

OUR INTEREST IS YOU 
SERVICE TO YOU IS FIRST 

FIRE CASUALTY AUTOHFE 
HOME LOANS

E M M 8TT 81R X W M

R i f lw 'i  TV S m k i  t  Sales
Your Zenith Dealer

DENNIS RATTAN TEX NAYLOR

Main Street874-3570

Typewriters — Calculators 
Adding Machines— 

ROY M. HORN 
TYPEWRITER 

REPAIR SERVICE 
1710 15th St. 

Wellington, Texas 79095

THE PAMPERED POODLE 
PARLORi Grooming, board­
ing, puppies for sale. Also 
pure bred Siamese kittens. 
665-1096, Pam pa. 
___________________ 30-tfc
HELP WANTEDi Night 
shift-male preferred. Apply 
•in person. Allsups.
_______________ 30-ltc
FEEEi Slx-wssk-eld mala- 
puppies 874-3685, 817 W.

___________________31-ltp

Wsslrkesptng and accounting 
supplies of all kinds, ledgers, 
ledger sheets, column#; 
pads, staplers, punches, 
rotex labelers, scotch tape of 
all kinds. Most any item you 
need.
Clarendon Office Supply A  
Printing, 104 S. Keanrey 
phone 874-2043.

“ ATTENTION
DEMONSTRATORS

TUNEUPS—MUFFLER 
Or

MAJOR OVERHAUL 
Om-Tbe-Fam Service 

STEVE’S AUTOMOTIVE 
A INDUSTRIAL 

323 S.K eaney 874-3446 
,TeBAILEY ESTES AND SON

W elding

> fantastic new Up 4  
ln>-Mlat M "  *Out Hydro-M ut Machine lor

4 HOW 11

BEFORE YOU arrange to
finance your uew or late 
model car. compare my new 
low cost finance rates. 1 can 
save you money.

Emmett O. Simmons 
at the Farmers State Bank 

3-tfc

1975 Bufcb, purchased by 
L.J. Harris, Twitty, from 
Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 M ck , purchased by 
Truman Bridges, Groom 
from Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 Balcfc, purchased by 
Beef Cattle Co., Wheeler 
from Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 OldsmsbBc, purchas 
ed by Larry Mooring, Barger 
from Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 OldsmaMIe, purchas­
ed by B.L. Betenbough, 
Shamrock from Chamberlain 
Motor Co.

1975 CadMar, purchased 
by Roy Tisdale, Wellington 
from Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 Batch, purchased by 
Donald Ritter, Groom from 
Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 Batch, purchased by 
Stan Shelton, Clarendon 
from Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 Paadac, purchased 
by Cynthia Boyle, Amarillo 
from Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 Batch, purchased by 
Thelma Longhofer, Booker, 
from Chamberlain Motor Co.

1975 Fard, purchased by 
Dennis L. Brsddock, Groom 
from Palmer Motor Co.

1975 Feed, purchased by 
Loyd C. Johnson, Garendon 
from Palmer Motor Co.

1975 Fard, purchased by 
Truett Hall, Garendon from 
Palmer Motor Co.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Price 
and son Gary of Sac Diego 
are in Clarendon visiting 
parents, Mrs. Gyde Price 
and Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd 
McCord.

Jerry is employed by 
Neyenesch Printers in San 
Diego as manager of instant 

; printing process.

Kimbra Anderson compet­
ed in Range 1 playday 
August 16, at the Rolling 
Hills Arena. Kim competed 
in nine games and placed 
first iq golfette. third in 
barrels, fourth iq flags and 
two man relay* and third in 
rescue.

The final playday of the 
year will be September sixth. 
The super finals between 
Range I, 11 and m  will be 
held September 27 and 28. 
Suoer finals will be held ia 
Quanah, October l l  and 12
between Ft. Worth 
Amarillo Areas.

and

MMn PInis Now

For Those Necessity Repair and Remodeling Jobs 

With MATERIALS From

Foxworth-Galbraith Lumber Co.
301 E

Lloyd McCord, Mgr. 
. 2nd. 874--------4-3334 Garendon, Texas

S 7 4 - m i

Bob Getman Cement

The Bob Getman Cement 
Contractor at 416 Caddo in 
Amarillo phone 383-7416 is 
regarded in this area by 
persons who have had them 
handle concrete contracting 
work for them as contractors 
who will complete the job 
when expected and in a 
professional manner.

They specialize in storm 
cellers, basements, boot pits,

J grain storage bins, stab 
oundations, side walks, 

drive ways and concrete 
finishing.

So whether you need 
concrete for foundations, 
walks, patios, commercial or 
industrial application, they

can be trusted to complete 
the job with highly skilled 
workmen who are completely 
familiar with this line of 
work.

The contractors here have 
strived since their beginning 
to furnish reasonably priced 
bids with the highest quality 
work.

For dependability, quality 
work and fair business 
dealings, the orginators of 
this 1975 Review make the 
suggestion to our readers 
that they contact the Bob 
Getman Cement Contractor. 
We know you’ll be glad you 
did.

MILO FARMERS
Buy Year

Crop insurance NOW 
And Save

a

Premium As Lew As *5*° Per *100°° Leverage

In Donley County

SEPTIC TANK-CESSPOOL CLOGGING| 
CAN NOW BE PREVENTED!

FAIRFIELD. N. J. —An 
amazing bacteria] discovery 
that prevents clogging of 
septic tanks and cesspools 
with a single, safe, and easy- 
to-use yearly treatment, has 
been developed by FX-Lab, 
Fairfield, N. J.

These proven organisms— 
FX-4 for septic tanks, FX-7 
for cesspools, and FX-11 for

118 N.

both sluggish systems are 
now available locally.

Available also is a free 
booklet. "The Story of Willie 
Bacteria, or How To Take 
Care of Your Septic Tank 
or Cesspool," from:

W A LT KNORPP T0 0 0  KNORPP

•7 4 -3 4 7 6

i, I ra n

MSURANCE
P Iim m  1 7 4 -3 5 2 1
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Mr*. BUI Crisp was in 
McLean on business last 
Saturday afternoon.

Mr. Ed Grice and children 
and Mrs. Blanch Grice, sister 
of Mrs. A.H. Moretnan 
visited the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. A.H. Moretnan.

Dr. and Mrs. Jim Vineyard 
and sons left Friday 
afternoon for Dallas, where 
he will be working this week 
in a soul winning conference, 
his parents the P.M. Gibsons 
really did enjoy their visit. 
While they were here they all 
toured Palo Duto Canyon, 
and attended the rodeo at 
Pampa along with the Darrel 
Gibsons.

Visiting in Alanreed on 
Tuesday, August 4 was Mr. 
and Mrs. George Smith and 
sons Steve and Keven. 
George was a former supt. at 
the Alanreed school. They 
now reside at Canton, Okla.

Rev. John Thames visited 
in the Jim Harrision home 
and the P. M. Gibson home 
and the BUI Crisp home on 
Wednesday of last week.

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Harrison were 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Cadalbert 
from CookviUe and Mr. and 
Mrs. J .C . Harrison of 
Navada, Texas.

Olan Stapp was hospitaliz­

ed several days last week
following a car accident in 
which he suffered a whip 
lash. With him at the time of 
his accident were two of his 
grandchildren. He is pre­
sently recuperating at home.

Agriculture produces effi­
ciently and in volume, only 
under private enterprise

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
W.H. Davis last week were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Corbin 
and Eddy. Other guests were 
Mr. and Mrs. Jam es 
Breithling and Tony of 
Groom. On Saturday Mr. and 
Mrs. Willis May of Panhand­
le.

Mr. and Mrs. G.L. 
Simmons and Brett flew to 
Galveston where they will 
visit with Mr. Simmons son, 
Merl Wayne.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Burch 
of Whitedeer spent Sunday 
with the J.A. Hills.

Mrs. Virginia Dalton of 
McLean visited here Thurs­
day with Mrs. Lena Carter 
and went down to the Carter 
Apple Orchard.

Mrs. Paul Averitt and 
famUy of Amarillo spent the 
weekend with the O.W. 
Stiu>ps.

Robeiobert Bruce made a 
business trip to Amarillo last 
Monday.

Dee Medley, unde of Curg 
Hill, is in the Groom 
Hospital.

On Friday, Judge BUlie 
Christa] and “ Curly” Mon­
roe visited in the Jess Finley 
home. While here they, 

with Mr. Finley, made 
of the rain 

damage to the roads and 
bridges in this part of the 
county.

Mrs. Cecil Carter was in 
Pampa on business last 
Wednesday.

Judy Averitt of Amarillo is 
visiting her grandparents 
this week. They are the Olin 
Stapps.

Mrs. Bert McKee visited 
in Pampa last Wednesday. 
Her daughter Mr. and Mrs. 
Allan Alfred and Scott of 
Spearman returned with her 
to spend the night and all 
went to Amarillo on 
Thursday.

A bore is a person who has 
nothing to say-and says it.

Mr. and Mrs. W.R. Beck 
and children spent Sunday 
evening at Greenbelt Lake.

Robin and Sam Stubbs 
spent some time at 4H camp 
the week of the 27th.

Mrs. A1 Cooke had her 
niece and family visit with 
her the first of last week.

Faye West Moreland of 
Lubbock and Bertha Wilkins

of Roswell, N.M. and Gladys 
Hommel of Clarendon visited 
in the A.N. H a rd n k  home 
last week.

Mr. and Mrs. A.N. 
Hardman visited the Frank 
Hommels in Clarendon last 
week.

Today, one out of every 
three meals is eaten out. 
Tomorrow it will be one out 
of two. By the year 2000 the 
stove may be obsolete.

Rev. and Mrs. John

Thames, pastor of the 
Alanreed Baptist Church 
announced their plans to fly 
to Alaska next week to visit 
relatives. They will be 
accompanied by their son 
and daughter, the trip being 
a graduation gift to their 
daughter. We wish them a 
happy time. They do not plan 
to miss any services in 
Alanreed.

Save energy-God gave us 
only so much of it.

Mr. ang Mrs. Coy Smith

are the newest residents in 
Alanreed, they have two 
children which will be in 
school starting next week. 
The Smiths moved into the 
bouse next to the Alanreed 
Gym.

Mr. and Mrs. William 
Bradley and children were in 
Amarillo last Saturday o n ' 
business.

Iam sfraid that there is not 
enough interested parties to 
keep this news column going

to therefore this is the last 
time it will appear unless 
interest picks up. If you 
decide you want it to 
continue let me know and 1 
will start it agian, but it takes 
news being reported to me 
before it can be written as 1

can not write something 1 do. 
not have. I have enjoyed 
writing this column and hate 
to discontinue it.

U you do decide you want 
it to continue please call me, 
Mrs. Jess Finley-779-3147. 
Thank you.

Ladies Golf

Dirty Golf, each player has 
the privilege of making his 
opponent re-play any four 
shots during the round. 
These are to be shots which 
he considers lucky or feels 
cannot be duplicated.

(1.) Susan Adty, Kathryn 
Cain, Barbara Maddox (2) 
Nell Barnhill, Jeanette Case, 
Alice Courtney (3) Avis 
Benson, Glen Bromley, Billie 
Chauveaux (4) Frances 
Deyhle, Jane Gilkey, Maxine

l

Hardin (S) Zenna Belle Ginn, 
Deen Hood, Dorothy Knorpp 
(6) Glen Green, Georgia 
Guinn, Carole Karr, Donna 
Knorpp (7) Malinda Me- 
Anear, Peggy Minkley, Neita 
Moseley (8) Evelyn Moore, 
Ruth Neal, Betty McCrack­
en, Carolyn Payne (9) Mable 
Dean Porter, Frances Skel­
ton, Sandi W allace, Sue 
Mclver (10) Nancy Shelton, 
Kaye White, Sherry Welch 
(11) Dianne Cham berlain,. 
Barty Grant Malba Vaughan.

W iners far Ladles Golf 
Ass’s  Play day, August 14

Championship: Medalist, 
Mary Hudgins; Playday, 
Sandi Wallace.

First Flight: M edalist, 
Kathryn Cain; Playday, 
Frances Skelton, Maxine 
Hardin (tie).

Second Flight: Medalist, 
Avis Benson; Playday, Mal­
ba Vaughan, Thelma Watt­
ers (tie).

Third Flight: M edalist, 
Donna Knorpp; Playday, 
Glen Green.
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Autwm ee

Creamery Made from

Butter Cow Milk

Maryland Club

(d o t

Coffee ““ S119
Golden Harvestoiaen Harvest

Orange Prink 46 Oz. 2  Cans i | m i )  , „

PRODUCE$ | 1 9
New Crop East Texas

Sweet Potatoes

2 5 *
California Thompson

Grapes ss

White

Kraft
War

Curity 

W * f

30 Daytime 

Kraft

Van Camps

59*
* * * 1 8 0 z .

3 jars $|®° f  Vienna Sausage All Meat Cans $ i ° ° i
Lean Meaty and Delicious

Cured Picnic Hams
Afmours’dhoppedBsef’ * * * ’ ’

Lipton instant

Lb

Luncheon Meat 12 Oz. Can

4 9 !

Potatoes 10 Lb. Bag

California Green Bell

Peppers u>.
Arizona Large Firm Heads

Lettuce Each

moot opeutcminMm

Stokleys

Fruit Cocktail
Bake Rite

3 Oz. Jar

30 Cnt. Box

• Kotex Reg or Super

Feminine Napkins
Brawny Northern

Paper Towels Jumbo Roll

! Staf-Puf

Fabric Softener *Galkm Ju*
Folgers

Instant Coffee 100z Jar e
; Minute Maid Frozen

Orange Juice 12 Oz. Can

I 80"16" 5 Asst Flavors
• Ice Cream & gallon Rnd Cnt.

Special far Weak

uSDAGrade"A"

Fryers
Shurfresh

M m  * *
Pure Vegetable

Shortening 3 Lb. Can

2  303 Cans 7 9 *  

$ 1 3 9

Lb

5S k f s

I §hui¥eshlean Vacuum P a c k |

Bacon1 Lb. Pkg.

2 for

Plastic

Freezer Boxes 8  im  Containers
IVOfy M
Liquid Detergent 22 0z. Bottle Q Y *

!Fa,or <  ■  i o

Furniture Polish 12 Oz. Aero Can *  |

Shurfresh USDA Good Lean & Tender

Beef Roast Blade Chuck

Patio

Frozen Dinners

fite d

Lb.

"for electric dishwasher"

Cascade 50 oz.̂
Shurfresh Vacuum Pack

Franks 120zPkgAll Meat
Loose Leaf 300 Sheet Pkg.

Notebook Paper 89 5 holeAug 28,21,23 and 23.

Clifford Grocery
SAN M EEN STAMPS EVERY BAY D0VK1C ON TWESBAY

Kitty

Cat Feed

Bordens Vi Gallon

Laundry Detergent

Home Laundry 

Size

d m /
Shurfine Whole

New Potatoes $ f  00
4  303 Cans

Buttermilk 7 5 *

r t


