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First Baptist Church 
to hold revival
First Baptist Church in Garendon 

will be holding revival services 
Sunday. April 20 through Wednes­
day, April 23. These services are in 
conjunction with the nationwide ef­
fort of Southern Baptists to have 
simultaneous revival meetings. 
Thirty thousand churches will par­
ticipate in this evangelistic effort.

Revival evangelist will be Harold 
Elliott. Harold Elliott pastored 
churches for thirty years and now

Ashtola to host mixed 
volleyball tournament

The Ashtola Community will host a 
mixed volleyball tournament April 18 
and 19th.

For those of you that might not 
know what a round robin is, it is 
where each team will play every team 
entered. All teams will play seven 
matches. We are having eight 
entries. A team must win at least 4 
of the seven matches to qualify for 
playoffs.

A mixed tournament involves 3 
women and 3 men on a team. The 
hits must be alternate. At times this 
is pretty difficult to do.

The games will star start at 5:30 
Friday night and 9:30 Saturday 
morning and run all day Saturday.

There will be no door admission,

CISD to sponsor for 

parents only nights
When the family is home in the 

evening, some topics of discussion 
include who’s turn is it to do the 
dishes, who forgot to fill the car up 
with gas. and perhaps the need to 
buy new tires for the teen-agers car.

These topics are fairly common in 
most families. However other 
problems seem to consume other 
families such as teens staying out too 
late and smelling of alcohol when 
they do come home; periods of deep 
depression where the child stays by 
himself too often and too long or 
perhaps the child's friends who seem 
to be doing all the wrong things.

To address these problems, the 
Clarendon Independant School 
District is sponsoring For Parents 
Only: Coping with Current Social 
Concerns. This program will be 
divided into two separate sessions, 
one presented to parents of elemen­
tary and junior high students May 
1st. and to parents of high school 
students May 8th. The sessions will 
begin at 7:00 each night with one

Tommie Saye 
Cooperative Observer 
for National Weather
Service,

T
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Day Date HI Low

Monday 7 90 55
Tuesday 8 69 47
Wednesday 9 54 42
Thursday 10 57 45
Friday II 68 48
Saturday 12 75 49
Sunday 13 90 37

Total Preclp. for Month 
Total Preclp. for Year

14
I 80

hour programs given by representa­
tives from such organizations as 
Suicide Prevention and Crisis Inter­
vention, Catholic Family Service, 
Panhandle Planned Parenthood, and 
the Amarillo Council on Alcoholism.

Please watch this paper for further 
information as to room assignments 
and speakers. Keep your calendar 
open for the above dates. Problems 
occur in most families. Here is a 
chance for you to become more aware 
of help that is available.

Applicators

certification

meeting to be 

held April 21
A  private applicators certification 

meeting will be held at 9 a.m. on 
Monday. April 21, 1986, in the Ranch 
Operations Gassroom located in 
Vaughn Hall at Garendo.. College, 
according to County Extension Agent 
Ronald Gooch. The producers at­
tending will have an opportunity to 
complete a request for Private Appli­
cators Certification which will be 
forwarded to the Texas Department 
of Agriculture for issuance of certifi­
cation.

A certified private applicator can 
use or supervise the use of any 
pesticide that is classified for re 
structed use for producing any 
agricultural commodity on property 
owned or rented by him or his 
employer.

For more information contact 
Ronald Gooch at the County Ex­
tension Office. 874-2141.

First BankS Trust to display Texas flags

serves as chaplain of the Arlington 
Police Department.

Music director for the services will 
be Ronnie Armstrong. Bro. Arm­
strong is pastor of First Baptist

Church, Graham, Texas.
Services will be at 11:00 a.m. and 

7:00 p.m. Sunday. Monday through 
Wednesday, there will be noon Bible 
study and evening services at 7:30 
p.m.

so if you want to see and do 
something different this weekend, 
come on up to the old college gym 
across the street south of the high 
school and enjoy some free enter­
tainment.

Teams entered are: Staven- 
hagen’s, Firemen and Firebelles 
with 2 teams, Alderson’s, Ron’s 
Crew, Rat Pak, Mixed Nuts and 
Riders in the Sky.

We are planning a terrific con­
cession with hamburgers, nachos, 
Mexican salad, chef salads and 
sandwiches. Also we are having 
homemade brownies. Rice Krispie 
squares and best o f all homemade ice 
cream which we will have Saturday 
afternoon. See you there.

Representative of the most im­
portant moments in our state’s 
history, momentos of the Texas spirit 
and gifts grand enough for The 
Prince o f W ales...all o f these 
describe the historic flags of Texas 
which will be displayed at a special 
reception at the First Bank &  Trust 
of Garendon. April 18. from 6:30 to 
9:00 p.m.

In celebration of beginning its 75th 
year of service to Garendon and the 
Panhandle area, and of the Texas 
Sesquicentennial the bank has pur­
chased these ten limited edition 
replicas as their gift to the people of 
the Panhandle for their enjoyment 
and education.

"W e ’re proud to have this set of 
historic fla gs ,”  said Bronnie 
McNabb, president of the bank 
“ This is our gift to the community 
and our area. We want these flags to 
be used as exhibits in libraries, 
schools and museums for many years 
to come.”

The flags, which have been care­
fully researched the faithfully re­
created, are entirely handmade from 
pure silks and cottons that match the 
tabnes used 150 years ago.

Only 950 sets of these flags will be 
produced and because they are 
considered so rare and rich in 
heritage a set was presented to 
Prince Charles during his recent visit 
to Texas.

Each flag on display is framed and 
has a descriptive plaque giving the 
history behind it.

This historical collection includes 
replicas of The Alamo Rag, the first 
Lone Star Rag and the Rrst Rag of 
the Republic. Also included is the 
San Jacinto Flag. This flag was 
carried into battle by Sam Houston 
and his men when they declared 
victory over Santa Anna. The attack 
began with the cry “ Remember the 
Alamo”  and ended less than 20 
minutes later. The original of this

Broncos win

at Levelland

The Garendon Bronco boys track 
team won their fourth straight track 
meet Saturday at Levelland. The 
meet was very tough as the winning 
Broncos scored a total of 72 points.

Once again several of the bovs 
improved on their times. Gay Sharp 
got the only first places the Broncos 
could get. Sharp won the 1600 meter 
run and the 3200 meter run. His 
times were 10:26.65 and 4:49.48 

Russell Alexander was second in 
discus with a throw of 145’ 10” . 
Donnie Chambless was third in the 
3200 meter run and fourth in the 1600 
meter run. His best times of the year 
were 10:33.% and 4:54.21 were run 
Saturday.

James Ariola was third in the 200 
meter dash in 23.43. Robert Young 
blood was third in 300 meter in 
termediate hurdles and fourth in the 
110 meter high hurdles in times of 
41.73 and 16.1.

Don Brogdon was sixth in the shot 
with a throw of 44’ lV i” .

Steve Phillips was fourth in the 800 
meter dash with a time of 2:03.5. his 
best of the season.

The two relays ran their best times 
of the season as they ran a 45.0 and 
3:31.5.

The Broncos will run in the district 
meet Friday at Shamrock. The 
prelims start at 10:00 a.m. and the 
finals at 7:30 p.m.

Democratic 

precinct convention 

to meet May 3
Democratic precinct conventions 

will convene at each of the following 
places in each precinct. There will be 
one precinct convention in each 
precinct. Precinct I will meet at the 
Patching Gub House; Precinct 2 will 
meet at Donley County Court House. 
Precinct 3 at Hedley Lions Gub and 
Precinct 4 at First Bank A Trust 

These conventions will begin 
shortly after 7:00 p m . May 3. so
ptc tv- prompt

flag is the only original of the ten 
flags to survive those historic times. 
The original San Jacinto flag is now 
hanging in the State Capitol in 
Austin.

The flags are the brainchild of Ted 
Pearsall. Director of The Gallery of 
the Republic, in Austin.

Pearsall thought up the idea of 
researching, reproducing and selling 
the flags two years ago. He thought 
the flags would give Texans a focal 
point and would* help spark interest 
in learning more about Texas.

“ Sets of these flags will be used as 
rotating exhibits throughout schools

ANNETTE OSBURN of Firebelles Chief, with a check for SI ,000 for Hre 
presents Delbert Robertson, Fire Dept, building fond.

Clarendon College to 
hold reunion

Nostalgia and appreciation of the 
good old days are very fashionable in 
Teias in 1986. April 26 and 27 will 
be the weekend for alumni of Claren­
don College to gather to bask in fond 
memories o f their youthful past and 
to share their present with fellow 
classmates. Residents of Donley 
County who have ever attended 
Clarendon College should take 
special advantage of this opportunity 
to support their alma mater.

Special programs have been 
planned for this year. Registration at 
9 a.m. in the college cafeteria will 
kick off a weekend of visiting and 
reminiscing on Saturday. April 26. 
For history and architecture buffs, 
the highlight of the reunion may be 
the tea on Saturday afternoon 3-5 in

Lady Broncos finish 
2nd at Wellington
The Lady Broncos track team 

completed a successful come from 
behind victory April 5th at the Rocket 
Relays in Wellington. Being down 
by two points to Quanah going into 
the last event, the 1600 meter relay, 
the Lady Broncos finished second in 
the race. However, they beat 
Quanah which assured them a team 
victory. Results were:

Shot put - Larinda Pettit. 3rd, 
29’9'/i” ; Jenifer Davis. 4th 28’5".

Discus - Larinda Pettit. 2nd. 
lOriO '/i” ; Tina Alexander. 3rd, 
88’ l'/ i” ; Sharon Bright. 4th. 82’4'/i”  

High Jump - Janet Risley, tie 4th, 
4’6” .

Triple Jump - Janet Risley. 5th, 
30’ 1” .

3200 meter run - Christi Knorpp. 
1st, 13:45.58; Marj Ekleberry, 4th. 
14:53.11.

800 meter run - Janet Risley, 1st. 
2:28.90; Kristal Hill, 5th. 2:48 51 

100 meter hurdles - Brigett Spier. 
6th. 21.16.

800 meter relay - Amy Johnson. 
Tanya Bell. Stacy Graham. Brigett 
Spier. 6th, 1:58.06.

400 meter run - Janet Risley. 2nd. 
62.29.

200 meter dash Lisa Burch, 3rd. 
29.50; Tanya Bell. 4th. 30.02.

1600 meter run - Christi Knorpp. 
1st, 6:15.97; Marj Ekleberry. 3rd. 
6:33.99; D’ Liss Robinson. 4th. 
6:38.24.

1600 meter relay - Janet Risley. 
Kristal Hill. Lisa Burch. Brigett 
Spier. 2nd. 4:27 95.

The Lady Broncos track team 
encountered some very strong com­
petition at the relays in Panhandle on 
April 12th Even though the team 
finished in 5th place overall, there 
were some outstanding perform 
•rnces. Janet Rislev set a meet and

school record in the 800 meter run. 
while Christi Knorpp set a new 
school record in the 3200 meter run. 
The results of the meet were:

Discus - Larinda Pettit. 3rd 
104'1 ” .

Long jump - Lori Roberson. 6th 
14’4‘/ i" .

Triple jump Janet Rislev. 6th, 
30'8'/j".

400 meter relay - Linde Bowling, 
Tanva Bell. Lori Roberson, Stephanie 
Luttrell, 6th, 56.49 

3200 meter run - Christi Knorpp. 
5th, 13:28.70, new school record.

800 meter run - Janet Risley. 1st, 
2:26.05. new school and meet record.

100 meter dash - Brigett Spier 
2nd. 13.43.

400 meter dash Janet Risley. 1st,
61.73.

200 meter dash - Brigett Spier 
4th. 28.05.

1600 meter relay - Janet Risley. 
Kristal Hill, Lisa Burch. Brigett 
Spier. 5th, 4:24 %.

The Lady Broncos will compete in 
the district meet at Shamrock on 
Friday. April 18th

Chamber of 

Commerce banquet 

Thursday night

The Chamber of Commerce Ban 
quet will be held Thursday. April 
17th at the Community Center, 7:30 
p.m If you have not purchased your 
ticket, you may do so by contacting 
the Chamber of Commerce office. 
Tou mav also pun-hase tickets a. the 
door.

in Texas for decades, not just during 
the Sesquicentennial,”  Pearsall said.

Currently, First Bank A  Trust has 
the only set of these flags for public 
display in the Texas Panhandle. 
Following the 18th the flags will be 
on display during regular bank hours 
for the community to enjoy.

Mrs. Stella M a e

A le xan d e r funeral

services held 

Tuesday

the newly restored home of Zell 
SoRelle at 507 W. 5th. This fine 
example of the Queen Anne Victorian 
style has been designated by the 
Texas State Historical Commission 
and also recognized by the National 
Registrar. Saturday evening at 7 the 
ex-students banquet will be held in 
the college cafeteria as will be the 
Sunday luncheon at 12:30. Tickets 
for these meals will be $8 each. 
Guest speakers will update on-going 
curriculum and activities at Garen­
don College. Remember to bring or 
send your $2 annual membership 
dues to continue support of the Ex­
students' Association. For further 
information contact Susie Shields. 
Box 186, Lelia Lake. Texas 79240. 
(806) 874-3793.

Funeral services tor Mrs. Meiia 
Mae Alexander, age 51, were held at 
2:00 p.m. on Tuesday, April 15, 1986 
in the True Church of God in Christ 
in Clarendon with Elder John Bowser 
and Rev. Tommy Ransom, officiat­
ing. Interment was in Citizens 
Cemetery in Garendon with arrange­
ments under the direction of Robert­
son Funeral Directors.

Mrs. Alexander died at 8:00 a.m. 
on Thursday, April 10, 1986 in Hall 
County Hospital in Memphis follow­
ing a lengthy illness. She was born 
September 15, 1934 in Idabel, Okla­
homa and moved to Garendon in 
1971 from Idabel. She was married 
to Gifford Alexander at Las Vegas, 
Nevada. She had worked for several 
years as a cook at the Country 
Kitchen. She was a member o< the 
True Church of God in Christ.

‘Survivors ihclude her husband, 
Gifford Alexander o f Garendon; six 
daughters. Gloria Wilson of Pampa, 
Bettve Ann Stewart of Garendon. 
Fran Wilson of Garendon. Kimberly 
Wilson of Garendon. Nita Alexander 
of Rialto. California, Jo Eva Alex­
ander of San Bemadino, California; 
eight sons. Gifford Alexander Jr. of 
Rialtoi, California. Ray Jean Alexan­
der of San Bernadino. California, 
Ellis Stewart of Amarillo, Stanley 
Wilson of Banning. California, Larry 
Wilson of Banning. California, Billy 
Wilson o f Clarendon. Glendale 
Hearn of Garendon, Hosea Hearn 
Jr. of Garendon; four sisters, Gara 
Harris of Los Angeles. California. 
Virginia Houston of Lemoore, Cali­
fornia. Annie Houston of Oklahoma 
City, Oklahoma. Ruby Stone of 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma; six 
brothers, Ellis Houston of Los An­
geles. California, Ardele Houston of 
North Carolina; Lester Houston of 
Lemoore, California. Stanley Hous­
ton of Salt Lake City, Utah, Cornell 
Houston of Lemoore, California, 
David Houston of Corkland, Cali­
fornia; 47 grandchildren; and one 
great grandchild.

Casket bearers were Mack Smith, 
Howard Weatherton, Willie Weath- 
erton, Freddie Reese, Andrew Tur­
ner. and Roger Harris.

G rave side  rites 

held for Jess 

W illis Finley

Jess Willis Finley, 69, of Alanreec 
died Wednesday, April 9.

Graveside services were at 2 p.m 
Saturday. April 12 in Alanreet 
Cemetery with the Rev. M.D. Smith 
retired Baptist minister from Pampa 
officiating. There was also Masonic 
graveside rites. Arrangements art 
bv Lamb Funeral Home of McLean.

Mr Finley, bom at Batesville, 
Ark., had lived in Alanreed since 
1946. He was married to Betty 
Myers in 1946 at San Jose. Calif. 
He was a rancher H ' served 24 
years as Donley County commission­
er. Precinct 4 He was a member of 
Alanreed Baptist Church and 
McLean Masonic Lodge No. 889 
He was a World War II veteran.

Survivors include his wife; a 
daughter. Mona of the home; a son. 
Dr Eddy Finley of Stillwater. Okla.; 
two sisters. Agnes Nickolauson of 
Las Vegas Nev and Goldie Powell 
of Hereford: and three grand­
children
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H cookies, hushpuppies, milk, tern.

Friday-Exercise 11 s.m ., musical jam
7 p.m.
Monday-Exercise 11 s.m., dance 
practice 7-9 p.m.
Tneedny-Exercise 11 am . 
W edneaday-Eaerdse 11 a.m., arts A  
crafts 1 p.m.

SENIOR CITIZEN MENU 
April 17-23

'•Fried fish, french fries.

Let's com pare
M aybe  I can save  you som e  

m oney on insurance:

Allstate
You’re in good hands.

A IliUnt* Insurance Company 
%I1 stau Ijfe  Insurance Co . Northbrook I t

Life Homeowners Auto/ 
Boat RV Business-Health

EMM^TO. SIMMONS

JEM S IM M O N S  
8 7 e-350b

coffee.
Friday-Baked ham with pineapple,
yam patties, broccoli with cheese 
sauce, Jello-red. apple cobbler, din­
ner rolls, milk, tea, coffee. 
Monday-Smothered chicken, fried 
squash, english pea salad, fresh 
pineapple on orange Jello, hot rolls, 
milk, tea, coffee.
Tuesday-Roast beef with natural 
gravy, mashed potatoes, bruaael 
sprouts, carrot and raisin salad, pear 
halves, dinner rolls, milk, tea, coffee. 
Monday-Smothered chicken, fried 
squash, english pea salad, fresh 
pineapple on orange Jello, hot rolls, 
milk, tea, coffee.
Tuesday-Roast beef with natural 
gravy, mashed potatoes, brussel 
sprouts, carrot and raisin salad, pear 
halves, dinner rolls, milk, tea, coffee. 
Wednesday-Hamburger steak with 
brown gravy, macaroni and toma­
toes. apple and cabbage salad, egg 
custard, dinner rolls, milk, tea, 
coffee.

The Clarendon Press la 
every Thursday at 106 S. 
and entered as Second Class Matt at 
the post office at Clarendon, Tuns. 
J.C. and Helen Woody, puhttahera 
and editors.

Any erroneous reflection upon the

In these rolamns w tt be 
gladly and promptly corrected upon 
being brought to the attention o f the

AO pictures used In The (
Press which are not the 
Ik e  Clarendon Press must be picked 
up In 10 days from publishing date.

Look Who’s

New
Kayla Renos Qufanby

Glen and Jamie Quimby o f Satan- 
ta, Kansas proudly announce the 
arrival o f a beautiful baby girl, Kayla 
Renee, April 3, 1986, weighing 7 
pounds Vi ounce. She was welcomed 
home by brother J.D. and spent a 
wonderful week with Clarendon 
grandparents Mr. and Mrs. James 
McAnear Jr. and great grandparents 
Mr. and Mrs. J.A. McAnear. Kan­
sas grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Dennis Quimby. Great grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Glen Randle and 
Myrtle Quimby.

New Cars

\ % •» .ml.

PO tfltO ijtt P o tn tn

REGULAR, BARBECUE, SOUR CREAM A ONION, 
UNSALTED OR JALAPENO l CHEDDAR LAY'S®

POTATO 
CHIPS

09
f'« «*- *! * -f+’it REG, 

$1.39

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

PRICES EFFECTIVE APRIL 17-18-19, 1986 
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST

ALLSUP'S

ICE CREAM 
69

ROUND CARTON
HALF

GALLON

TV SPfCIAL 
OSCAR MAYER

MEAT
WIENERS

TV SPECIAL 
CITRUS HILL FROZEN

ORANGE
JUICE

16 0Z. 
CAN

USE OUR

MONEY ORDERS
4
ONLY

YV SPECIAL 
PRICE SAVER

GRANULATED
SUGAR

s ,  $179
BAG

Saver
Sugar

'AL

BORDEN S ASSORTED

DIPS

59<• oz.
CTH.

M O V IE  & VCR
R EN TA LS A a m i .

The Very Best in
w  r f lC K  % 0liS

Hom e Video 
Enterteinment!

COKE-CLASSIC COKE-DIET COKE-SPRITE

ALL YOU NEED 
IS YOUR TV! $ 4 1 9

1986 O lds by E.J. Roberts, 
Catiadian.

1986 GMC Jimmy by Paul Payne, 
Pampa.

1985 Olds by Joe Mothershed. 
Memphis.

1966 Buick by Dr. p.A . Presler,f 
Childress.

1986 Buick by Charles L. David­
son, Memphis.

1966 Buick by Judy C. Oates, 
Childress.

1986 Olds by Ruth Meadows, 
Pampa.

1986 Olds by Wilma Hefley, 
Shamrock.

1986 Buick by Kenneth Jackson, 
Groom.

1986 Buick by Mrs. W .O. Hom- 
mel, Alanreed.

1985 GMC Jimmy by Carolyn 
Myers, Lake view.

1986 Pontiac by H .A. Bryan, 
Sweetwater, OK.

1986 Buick by Billy. L. Talley,
Hedley.

1986 Cadillac by Beatrice E. 
Thomas, Wellington.

1986 Olds by Goldalene Poling, 
Childress.

1986 Buick by Cloyce T. Hole man, 
Childress.

1986 Pontiac by Lesley J. Brooks, 
Shamrock.

1986 Buick by John Sarich, 
Clarendon.

1986 GMC PU by John Scamahorn, 
Amarillo.

1986 Olds by Thomas Nance, 
Amarillo.

1986 Olds by John M. Bauler, 
Clovis, N.M .

T R IP L I C If

• P IN IN G

The Christian Community Center 
is opening soon. the Center is 
located behind Steve’ s Garage on the 
corner o f Kearney and East 4th 
Streets, across from the Post Office.

The Christian Community Center 
*■ for *n people o f all denominations 
and all races, the Center will provide 
a youth center where your young 
people can come and fellowship in a 
Christian enviroment with Christian 
supervision nights and Saturdays. 
The Center will also have a Kids 
Klub for elementary-age children 
evenings after school. The Center 
will be a coffee house for adults 
during the day, and will house a 
Christian Book Store, and a snack 
bar.

This is a non-profit Christian 
organization. The Center’s director, 
Mrs. Helen Rogers, requests any 
donations from churches, businesses 
or individuals, and all contributions 
are tax deductible. The Center is in 
need o f dining tables and chairs, new 
and used Christian books, book­
shelves, a kitchen stove, a kitchen 
counter and cabinets, or a glass 
display bar, an ice machine, a 
refrigerator, and many oother items, 
along with any financial contribu­
tions. Come and see the Center or 
call 874-2315. '

1926
Book Clob
Hie 1926 Book Club held their 

annual guest day March 18, 1986 at 
the Patching Club House. The social 
committee, Dikki Howell, Glenda 
Hawkins and Norma Jones, served : 
chips and dips, cookies and candies, 
tea and coffee to members and 
guests present.

Oressa Delaney announced that 
she and her husband were moving • 
from Clarendon to Canyon. W e 
regret this, but our best wjshes go 
with them.

Our guest speaker was Ul, so 
President Frieda Tucker called on 
ladies present to tell about a book 
they enjoyed reading. Several 
resonded and we were inspired to 
read these books mentioned. There 
were 20 present including 5 guests: 
Nell VitareUe, Lockie Pitts, Rachael 
Butler, Dorothy White, Viola Bones, 
Mary Hazel VanZandt, Jesse Adams, 
Evelyn Mann, Thelma Shields, Sufie - 
Shields, Glenda Hawkins, Dikki 
Howell, Norma Jones, Oressa De- - 
laney, Frieda Tucker and guest 
Imogene Brumley, Polly Sarich, 
Naomi Phelan, Murle Butts and

Della Stark.
The 1926 Book Club met in regular 

session April 1, 1986 at the Patching 

Club House. Hostess Carolyn Hamil­
ton was not present but Frieda 
Tucker took over for her and also 
others helped serve the refresh­
ments. *

Mary Hazel VanZandt conducted 
the meeting. The dub read the dub 
collect. The minutes o f the previous 
meeting were read by Betty Veach, 
recording secretary, and they were 
approved. President Frieda Tucker 
announced that the citizenship pins 
had arrived. <.

The program was turned over to 
Glenda Hawkins who presented a 
presentation on the. “ Shroud o f 
Turin,”  explaining the authenticity 
of the shroud (burial cloth) for Jesus 
Christ when he was crucified on the 
cross. The program was very in­
teresting. She presented thoughts 
from several authors as to whether it 
was true or false. She brought out 
facts that had been discovered and 
this is truly the “ time for the 
shroud.”  Our technology maybe can 
prove that this is the “ real thing.”

Present were Dorothy Whitaker, 
Lockie Pitts, Nell VitareUe. Evelyn 
Mann, Mary Hazel VanZandt, Jessie 
Adams, Pauline Heath, Ethdyn 
Grady* Betty Veach, Dorothy White, 
Glenda Hawkins, Frieda Tucker.

K ing s K id s 

to perform
National Youth Day wUI be cele­

brated April 20, 7:00 p.m., in the 
Assembly o f God with the K ing’s 
Kids in charge o f the evening 
worship service. There will be 
special singing, instrumentals, and L 
skit, “ Jerusalem Dragnet.”  The 
public is invited.

Put cotton gloves or socks 
on your hands to wipe 
Venetian blinds dean.

YOUR VOTE & INFLUENCE WILL BE APPRECIATED

D O N E . C R O C K E T T
CANDIDATE FOR

C O U N T Y  C O M M IS S IO N E R  

PRECINCT NO. 4 
DONLEY COUNTY

, Paid For By Don E. Crockett * von ; >>#»*! 6 

SUBJECT TO ACTION Of The DEMOCRATIC PRIMARY *

EVA H ER M ESM EY ER  
REFLEXOLOGY

Call Collect For Appointment 806-248-4984
Stress, Nerves, Circulation, Relax

Helps To Normalizes Body

HALF DAY SERVICE $1 f> A A  
FROM AMARILLO I 9 »UU

373-5101 TX WATTS 1-800-692-4699

I'S C IO IIO U T
j e a n s  $  a  e o o

K elli
•t Shaker 

K a y

U k * * ‘
0 V O « * * *

© M - s

i t A * *

N O O K



W ifc w fc y-P ia i with cheese, but­
tered con , tossed salad, brown 
beans, chocolate cake, milk. 
TbaracUy-Chip 0  Pie with cheese. 
Ranch Style beans, tossed salad, 
cinnamon rolls, milk. 
Frlday-Hamburger on bun, french 
fries, lettuce and tomato wedges, 
sliced cheese, pickles and onions, 
cherry cobbler, milk.

School
Menu

Spotlight
by Naomi Green

Baldland A m a n d a 0r° ° (n ’ D°r 1s 
and Bud and Betty White w en  
gnests during the weekend o f Cathy, 
Dennis and Jamie Leigh Vaughn.

Mary and Jerry Green, Christel 
•ad Little Jerry were in Memphis 
Sunday visiting with the Haskell 
Talleys.

Mr. and Mrs. Burl Holler. Minde 
and Monte went to Amarillo to 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Taylor out for 
dinner Friday evening to celebrate 
their 51st wedding anniversary.

Naomi Green and Laura Tucker 
w en  in Amarillo uesday for ap­
pointments with two doctors. Laura 
got a good report from both doctors. 
The ladies had lunch at Lubies on 
Counter Road.

Jeannie and Buddy Tittle o f Can­
yon came down Saturday to watch 
Teri perform in the Clarendon Col­
lege rodeo.

Regina, Janet and Renee spent the 
night Saturday with Roslie and L.A . 
Watson. They all went to church and 
met Teresa and Larry and everybody 
had lunch together Sunday.

Beth Watts o f Fritch and the new 
baby boy visited with H .A. and 
Naomi Green Thursday. They also 
went to see Adderine Mahaffey, 
Laura Tucker and by the school to say 
hello to Aunt Katherine who was 
substituting.

LaRue Pittman from Amarillo 
came with Dorothea Watson Led­
better to Clarendon for the weekend.

April 21-25
Mandny-Teachers inservice. 
Tuesday-Chicken fried steak with 
gravy, cream potatoes, buttered 
corn, hot roll, apple sauce and milk.

VICTORY TO A  TEENAGER
The Lord has promised to all 

believers victory over sin, the flesh, 
and the Devil, yet many Christian 
young people do not experience the 
overcoming power available to them. 
There are many areas where young 
people are defeated in their Christian 
life, but 1 believe the following three 
to be the most common.

Priorities. I f you will get your 
priorities in their proper order, you 
will have won half the battle. O f 
course, the number one priority is to 
have been born again by faith in 
Jesus Christ. Before anyone can 
ever attempt to live in accordance 
with God’s laws, he must first know 
Jesus Christ as his personal Saviour. 
Thank God, one can know his sins are 
forgiven and that he is going to 
Heaven (1 John 5:12,13)1 

After you have been saved, you 
must develop that dose personal 
relationship with Christ that can only 
be experienced as we “ Abide in 
Christ”  (John 15). The desire for 
every believer, young or old, ought to 
be, “ That I may know H im ....”  

Third, one should strive to love, 
honor and obey his parents (Eph. 6). 
You cannot be right with God if you 
are not right with your parents! 
Some teenagers think they can 
bypass their parents in obedience 
and still be in fellowship with Christ.

An impossibility! God has given to 
you young people parents to protect 
you and to train you.

Fourth, a Christian teenager 
should desire to work for the Lord 
Jesus during and throughout your 
teen years. Serving Christ through

Use an old shaving brush 
to dean pleated 
lampshades.

March 16 they left for Harlang where 
they met with traler Top o f Texas 
members from Fritch. Amarillo, 
tan p a  and Memphis. The group 
aurprised theuT one evening with a 
cake and dinner at Lubies celebrating 
their 50th anniversary. On tike way 
home they stopped at Houston to 
visit Hazel’ s sister Romaine and 
Aubrey Meador and girls and a 
nephew, Doug Cole, Yvonne and 
Miles. A t Wacy they attended 
Region Nine WBCC1 which is an­
other Airstream Trailer Club. They 
were entertained by a group from 
Baylor and other talented members 
o f trhe dub. They visited former 
Clarendon residents Wilma Batson, 
Gladys Seago and Sue Payne and her 
family. They -also saw Daisy Sparks 
and LaUna Morrow. Before the rally 
began they visited Lela McCarty in 
Austin. G>n the way home two more 
cousins were visited at Santa Anna, 
Elton and Bessie McDonald and 
Alaire and Elsworth Brandon. It 
rained in Waco. Those folks needed 
The Brandons tried to bring rain 
home with them but arrived with a 
pretty day instead.

How about a Gift Certificate 
for Mother’s Day or that

Graduate on your l i s t . ^ ^ ^ ^

Gift Cetlificates Available

healthy, youthful, athfc 
you’ve always wanted.

A1 Morrah Shrine Club will m 
Monday, Ajpril 21, at 7:30 p 
A ll members are urged to attend

120 W  3rd 
874-2760 

8 a.m. - 9 p.m
SJ T H E

W E  PU T IT

Your hometown newspaper is perfect for the 
local news you want to know But for state, 

national and world news, plus the best .sports 
coverage in Texas, you need The Dallas Morning 
News delivered to you. Contact your Dallas 
Morning News distributor or fill out this coupon 
today

Mease start mv subscription to The Dallas Morning News at 
once. I understand the daily and Sunday subscription price is 
19.00* monthly by* carrier or fi6.ltt** hywuii inside Texas and 
tIS 2V * outside Texas. Call us at 1-000-131-0010 to moke sure me 
have carrier service in your town.

•RftauiflVlLiaIR fK w Iln  n
f f W I t

ununuxs
d r a w e r

savings
r a n k

Plus jppiic jlik.* sdkrs las
n e a r l y

A BANK
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PLACE
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A  SOMsometh ml
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PEPOSms i.

*17S6 Camiaoie strap bra 
White. Beige and Black

B. CS6 48
D. D D (E )S6  S I

B. CS6 48
D. DD(E)M-5t

ways offer you the experience or, some- 
times, the security o f  bankers. In fact, the 
only place you’ll find a banker is T h e  Bank, 
■r S p k  where your deposits are Fed- 

\ erallY insured u p to $100,000. As 
i f g L ~ .il  f ° r multiplying, our Full Service 

l i i & r  Bank* is always ready and able to kf m  offer the newest ideas to help 
your money reproduce.

BIG GALS

a. CM 48
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K n o w s  h o w  to fit you ,  and  save money ,  too
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•77M  Cam intr (trap kmglifir I 
W hite. Rc ir «- and Black

TNINOOK O F  C L A R E N D O N
FDKI



W att’s Happening in Hedley
by Peggy Watt

17.

M Barbara B rin  o f 
i while be we* here. 

Guy. Fred end I visited with Linde 
aad Laagly for a while Saturday 

Leon was working. it’s

Nookie and Geraldine W iggins re­
cently enjoyed a short holiday at 
Lake Texhoma fishing. Nookie told 
me the biggest fish they caught 
weighed 35 pounds and that the 
smallest one was about two inches 
long. That’ s the kind I always 
caught...the 2 inch ones.

Mrs. Cassie Owens and Faye 
Naylor spent several days recently in 
Amarillo. Faye was welcoming a 
new grandson home. Jetty and 
Linda Frye. Tara and Jamie have a 
little boy. He’s Mrs. Owens great 
grandson. She visited with all her 
Amarillo children while she was 
there.

Harry Rowley and his sons Robert 
and Jeff camped out in our pasture 
Friday night and went turkey hunting 
Saturday. It was season for hunting 
bearded toms. Guy went with them, 
but he didn’t hunt. Jeff bagged one 
tom. Jeff and Rob are about the ages 
o f Guy and Keith. They go to school 
in Amarillo and Rob asked to camp 
out here as a gift for his birthday. 
Most boys would have asked for a 
party at a honky tonk. They are nice 
boys. While they were at the house, 
they looked at one o f the boy’s school 
annuals. They said the Hedley girls 
were all pretty. O f course, everyone 
knows that the prettiest girls in the 
world live in Hedley.

Lynn and Ginnie Cherry visited 
with his mother, Mrs. Etta Mae 
Cherry, last week. They brought 
their grandsons Jason Cherry o f 
Amarillo and B.J. Hamilton o f 
Howardwick with them.

Geneva M cAfee and Seth o f Can­
yon spent the weekend with her 
parents T.E. and Faye Naylor. They 
had supper Saturday evening with

her grandmother Mrs. Casaie Owens 
and when they got home, Tim Hall o f 
Amarillo was waiting to join them. 
They fished Sunday afternoon.

Opal Clendennen recently spent a 
few days with her family. Her sister 
Ahha Nelson o f Hudgens, TX came 
for her and she got to visit with her 
other sister Rosie Smiley o f Hudgens 
and her brothers Jake and June 
DeHart and Daniel and Patsy DeHart 
o f Cedar Creek, Texas. Tom and 
Tony took care o f themselves while 
she was gone and she told me nobody 
took them.

Marie Skaggs is recuperating at 
home following a recent surgery in 
Hall County Hospital.

John and Imogene Bain o f Sunray 
visited with her sister Mrs. Cassie 
Owens Thursday.

Pick Cox was home with Laqueta 
and Mrs. Holly during the weekend. 
He works at Stinnett and he either 
comes home or they go up there. 
Mrs. Holly recently had surgery and 
isn’ t about to do much going just yet.

John and Susan Hall and Levi 
brought lunch to his grandparents 
D.K. and Beulah Hall Sunday. Myr- 
tella Deahl joined them during the 
afternoon. Beulah’s son Gene 
Sanders o f Amarillo visited them last 
week. Beulah told me she had got 
the casts o ff her arms now and only 
had a wrapping on one o f them and 
that they were much better.

Gertrude Roller o f El Reno, Okla­
homa and Zonita Oesch o f Oklahoma 
are visiting their Hedley cousins, 
Walter Johnson and Alfred and Viola 
Johnson. Viola’s nephew, Jimmy 
Paul Davis o f Oklahoma City, is also 
visiting. Sis Martin and Matt and 
Kendray joined them Sunday after­
noon. ___________

Now Offering Contracts 
On Dry Blackeyed Peas 

For Further Information

Bob and Pat Harp o f Amarillo 
came during the weekend and built 
her her mother Mrs. Eva Hansard a 
new flower bed.

James and Nonie Hartwell and 
Leroy and Opal Hartwell spent the 
weekend with their mother, Mrs. 
Nora Hartwell.

Karah Lewis o f Quanah spent 
several days last week with her 
Hedley grandparents, Red and Dean 
Hill. They took her home Friday, 1 
think.

Clyde and Mildred Hoggard and 
Frank and Myrl Reger attended tfi£ 
Texas-Oklahoma Gospel Singing 
Convention at Quanah Easter week­
end. They attended the National Old 
Fiddlers Contest at Canyon last 
weekend. The reigning Miss Texas 
was one o f the competitors. Clyde 
and Mildred usually attend the 
musical at the Clarendon Senior 
Citizens, their son Bobby Hoggard, 
Bill, Audra, and Candi spent the 
weekend with them. Audra brought 
one of her friends, Brigett Bland with 
her.

Tode and Mattie Laura Hill went to 
Clarendon on business last week. 
Tode was fooling around and Mattie 
Laura had to get the rest o f her 
garden seeds. Actually, Tode was 
tending to business, too.

Tige and Jonnie Hill went to 
Childress Saturday to see their niece. 
Joy Stone, who is iU there.

Nina Riddlespurger took Loyd to 
Amarillo to the doctor lats week. 
The doctor told him he was doing 
good and if he continued to improve 
as he is, he will be as good as new 
before too long. Loyd broke his back 
during the winter in a fall. He’s like 
Fred and not used to being inactive, 
and that’s harder on him than 
anything.

Flossie Wood is with her daughter 
Joy Stone who entered the hospital in 
Wichita Falls for surgery this week. 
Joy’s sisters, Jane Wood, Jean
Stafford o f Carlsbad, New Mexico 
and Helen Soloman o f Fritch are with 
them. Hopefully Joy’ s surgery will 
be successful and she’ll be compleely 
well before too long.

Bess Grimes o f Amarillo visited 
with Tode and Mattie Laura Hill 
enroute home from visiting her

father-in-law in Carey.
J.T and Helen Lambersoo have 

been busy...busy...busy. They en­
tertained their grandaona, Mike and 
Donna Lamberson, Mikala and Aah- 
ley o f l>ampa and Randall Lamberson 
and his friends from Lubbock last 
week. On Tuesday and Wednesday 
they attended the sale at Wellington. 
Friday they visited with Bud and 
Alma Lamberson and Peggy Cloyd in 
Pampa and on Saturday they at­
tended the horse sale at Leila Lake. 
J.T.’s brother Earnest aad Shirley 
Lamberson sold all his registered 
paint and quarter horses. 1 asked 
Helen if  she’s heard from J.T.’ s 
cousin, Elsie Shaw, and she told me 
she hadn’t, but would surely like to. 
Are you listening elise??

Evelyn Messer attended the Delta 
Kappa Gamma meeting in W elling­
ton Saturday. She’s the incoming 
secretary o f the Kappa Gamma 
Chapter.

Jim and Nelda Hudson o f Amarillo 
visited with her mother, Mrs. Lillie 
Messer during the weekend. Their 
son Max Hudson spent the night with 
his grandmother one night last week.

Mrs. Albert Fulcher o f Wellington 
attended the morning worship ser­
vices at the First Baptist Church 
Sunday. Her granddaughter Kari 
Glenn sang. My spies told me that 
she was a very talented young lady. 
She’s certainly a very pretty ooe.

Kermit and Dorothy hopper o f 
Lelia Lake joined her mother Mrs. 
Nell Land and Augusta Duggins for 
visiting Sunday afternoon.

I talked to Ruth Stiles a few days 
ago about her mother-in-law, Mrs. 
Ruth Stiles, who lives in Medical 
Center Nursing Home in Clarendon. 
She told me she was still only able to 
be out o f bed for about an hour a day, 
but that ahe is able to feed herself 
now and is some better.

I hope I have Terry Bailey hope­
lessly confused. Actually, Johnny 
Stiles’ w ife is named Ruth and so is 
his mother. Now do you understand, 
Terry?

Raymond Stone o f Pueblo, Colo­
rado visited his mother, Mrs. Kate 
Stone recently. His wife, Amelia 
wasn’t able to come with him. Ray­
mond is recuperating from recent 
heart surgery. His sister, W illie Mae

today. More especially from week to 
W e only see Langly about 

a week, aad that’s not nearly 
i to spoil him much.

Su-San. Gail Johnson, and I  at- ' 
tended the Wellington Eastern Star 
meeting Tuesday evening. W e went 
to get the treasure chest back. 
They had had it for about two 
months. They elected officers and 
Mary Morriw was elected Worthy 
Matron for the coming year.
' Susan Lee is in Northwest Texas 
Hospital in Amarillo where she had 
major surgery Wednesday. She’s 
the daughter o f Roy Jr. and Sue

The Hedley Lioness Club met 
recently for the election o f officers for 
the coming year. The meeting was 
presided over by outgoing president 
Louise Stewart. Mary Ruth White 
led the opening prayer. Officers 
elected for the new year were 
Mahdeene Debord-president, Helen 
Lamberson-vice president, Evelyn 
M esser-lst vice president, Nora 
Hopper-2nd vice president, Dorothy 
Whitaker-3rd vice president. Nina 
R iddlespurger-treasurer, Shirley 
Slover-secretary. Members to the 
board o f directors are Jean Taylor, 
Tiny Harmon, Nell Hudgens, Juanell 
Canon.

Those enjoying the delicious meal 
were Louise Stewart, Nora Hopper, 
Dorothy Whitaker, Dorotha Craw­
ford, Pauline Kaufman, Betty W il­
liams, Juanell Carson, Mahdeene 
Debord, Sue Weatherly, Helen Lam­
berson, Sharon Fergerson, Evelyn 
Messer, Mary Ruth White, Patty 
Springer, and guest Miss Robin 
Springer.

Mr. Pickard took two teams to the 
judging contest at Texas Tech Satur­
day. In the Dairy Products contest, 
Susan Phelps was the 9th high 
individual, the team placed 3rd in 
the area and 4th in the contest. 
They qualified for the state contest to 
be held at Texas A&M  on April 26th.

The Dairy Cattle Judging team 
didn’t place for the state contest. 
Mr. Pickard didn’t get the results of 
the contest. The computer broke 
down and they will mail him the 
results.

Tony Monroe, Susan Phelps, and 
Cheryl Glover participated in the 
district tennis contest at Valley last 
week. None o f them placed in the 
contest.

The go lf team will play in the 
district tournament on April 16th. 
Shawn Bright and Chad W iggins will 
play on the team.

The district track meet will be held 
at Lefors on April 18th and 19th. 1 
didn’t find out who would be taking 
part in the meet, but think several o f 
the girls w ill be going and probably 
several o f the boys will go to bd with 
the gkis.

The state FHA Convention w fll be 
held in Dallas on April 26th. k%s. 
Pickard didn’t know which girls will 
be going because o f the FFA
contests.

The classes will be taking their 
six-weeks tests on April 17th and 
18th and on Monday, April 21st, the 
classes will observe Texas Sesqui- 
centennial day with a holiday. \ I 
guess every school in Texas will 
observe this day.

Holly White told me that Monday 
was her last day to go to school at 
Hedley. The Whites are 
Gran bury. I ’m sure Mandi will be
missed by her peer group, but Holly 
will be missed by everyone who 
comes in contact with her. She’s an 
adorable child.

The school board w ill meet at 8 
p.m. in the school library.

HEDLEY SCHOOL MENU 
April 22-25

Tneaday-Spaghetti and sauce, green 
beans, com, cheese strips, hot rolls, 
peach cobbler, milk.
W sdnaaday-Pinto beans, . spinach, 
tater tots, cornbread, fruit, milk. 
Thursday-Beef patties, cream pota­
toes, tossed salad, hot rolls, pine­
apple, milk.
Frlduy-Barbeque on bun. french 
fries, pickles and onions, chocolate 
cake, milk.
HEDUEY SENIOR CITIZEN MENU 

April 21-25
M onday-Chicken strips, gravy, 
mashed potatoes, fried okra, green 
vegetable salad, com muffin, oleo, 
fresh fruit cup, milk, tea, coffee. 
Taaaday-Steak with gravy, buttered 
com, blackeyed peas, carrot and 
raisin salad, com muffin, oleo. 
strawberry shortcake milk, tea cof­
fee.
W ednesday-Ham , glazed  sweet 
potatoes, cauliflower with cheese, 
lettuce and tomato salad, roll, oleo, 
apple crisp, milk, tea, coffee. 
Tharsday-W einers w ith beans; 
potato salad, creamy slaw, com 
muffin, oleo, bread pudding with 
raisins, milk, tea, coffee. 
Friday-Roast beef, fresh whipped, 
potatoes, fried okra, roll, oleo, 
waldorf salad, cherry cobbler, milk, 
tea, coffee.
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When the shadows of loneliness 
surround you, let in the light of 

G ods love.

<* A M E R IC A S  Find His love at a
Southern Baptist church 
near you.

( io d lim t iV iiu

CLARENDON:
F irs t  Baptist Church 
E van gelist: Harold E l l io t t  
Song Leader: Ronnie Armstrong 
Sunday-Uednesday, A p r il 20-23 -  7:30 ftn

BRICE:
Brice Baptist Church
E vangelist: T . J . Spry
Wednesday-Saturdayt ^ > r i l  23-27 -  7:^0 m

HEDLEY:

F irs t  Baptist Church ^
E vangelist: Melvin Hooten 
Wwkiesday-Smday, A p r il 23-27 -  7:30 HI

HOWARDWICK:
F irs t  Baptist Church 
Evangelist: D arre ll F eew ter 
►tonday-Sunday, A p ril 21-27 -  7:00 PM

Martin Baptist Church 
E vangelist: Mix Beard 

Sunday-We<kiesday, A p ril 20-25 -  7:30 PM



DOUBLE YOUR FOOD SAVINGS  
^ Monday, Tuesday, A Wednesday

YellowRusset

Green Giant

Kraft 1000 Island Buttermilk. Cucumber, Italian

Topping 5.6 Oz

Ghostbuster's 11 Oz

JELfcO

Carnation 22 Oz Jar

TV Brand Meat

Borden’sGooch German

Borden’sCry-o-vac Boneless

Choice Beef

Borden’sTV Brand sliced 12 Oz

Borden’s
Combination Pack 2 Loin Ends, 2 Rib Ends

Borden s

Detergent Detergent
Country Style Family Pack

W right’s Sliced Slab

Match light

SPAGHETTI
SAUCE



Thun., April 17. 1966

COACH M ICKEY McGUIRE was 
■elected FTA Teacher for March. 
He teaches physical science, phyalca, 
girls and boys athletics; he works 
with football and track. His wife la 
Sae and son Is Chance. Congratula­
tions for a Job well done!

M SS. HOW ELLCARRIE
FTA T<

She teaches 8th 
literacy, pre-algebra, alg 
pater math, A lg. I and 
word

Leland and Dynn. 
for a Job w e l done!

CLIFFORD, a Jaadar at 
elacted FTA’er far April, 
man a maaahar a f FTA 2 

la vary acttes hi FTA. 
M da the amen a f 

hi FTA. She participate In 
c imp a tad h  UIL Ready Writ- 
Headlines, Foataroa

FTA news
The Clarendon Chapter of FTA 

met on April 10, 1986 in room 103 at 
Oarendon High School, at 7:00 p.m.

The meeting was called to order by 
President Tammi Deen. Lesia Fus- 
ton was acting recording secretary in 
the absence of Rachel Bowling.

First on the agenda was the 
election of FTA’er for March and 
April and FTA Teacher for March 
and April. FTA’er for March is Sheri 
Chamberlain and FTA Teacher for

March is Coach Mickey McGuire; 
FTA ’er for April is Trisha Clifford 
and FTA Teacher for April is Mrs. 
Carrie Howell.
i The scholarship for a senior 
FTA ’er was explained. Guidelines 
were explained: the scholarship is in 
the amount o f $250 for a senior 
FTA’er only, planning to go into the 
teaching field in some capacity, must 
maintain a 3.0 grade average in

college, $125 will be given the first 
semester and $125 given for the 
second semester, can be any college 
in the state o f Texas, be in FTA for 2 
years. Senior members can now 
make application for the scholarship. 
They may pick up an application from 
Miss Veach in room 103.

The “ Student Teach”  project was 
discussed. The FTA’ers must have a 
day or two left from a 10-day extra 
curricular days to participate in the

SHERI CHAMBERLAIN, a Junior at 
CHS, waa elected FTA’er for March. 
She la extremely active In FTA. 
She currently held the vice presi­
dents office In local FTA, and District 
XVI financial secretary; she will also 
hold the office o f financial secretary, 
District XVI for 1986-87. She waa'a 

for state TFTA president. 
She participates In band and editor of 
Bronco annual. She has the honor of 
an Academic A ll American. She 
competed In UIL accounting, also 
newswritins and editorials.

project. Dates were discussed and 
student FTA’ers made their choice of 
elementary and junior high school 
teachers to observe in their classes.

Some activities for the last of 
school were discussed and planned.

Anyone interested in being an FTA 
member are encouraged to attend 
the meetings and join. The club is 
going to elect officers for next year in 
May and plan to have an officers 
installation with a salad or potluck

supper. All parents and teachers are 
invited to attend.

Summer activities were discussed. 
A booth for the July 4th celebration 
was discussed and agreed to have 
one.

The Wagon Train which is coming 
thru Oarendon was discussed. FTA 
would like to do something for the 
Wagon Train representing Oaren- 
don Schools.

Attending were Tammi Deen, 
Lesia Fuston, Sheri Chamberlain, 
Cindy Blanton, Jan Kidd, Marcy 
Helms, Amy Johnson, M aij Ekle- 
berry, Lisa Blanton, Sue Chambless, 
Trisha G ifford, Jennifer McAnear, 
David Porter, and Miss Betty Veach, 
FTA Advisor.

The Lion’s Tale

By GENE ALDERSON

When the white tapes on 
Venetian blinds becom e 
soiled, brighten by rubing 
on white liquid shoe polish.

The Oarendon Lions Oub held its 
regular meeting at noon on Tuesday 
at the Lions Hall. Twenty-six mem­
bers, Lion Sweetheart Jessie Adams 
and one guest were present. Fol­
lowing the regular opening cere­
mony, Liontamer Messer introduced 
John McGee of Dallas who is with 
Merchants Frieght Lines. He was 
the guest o f Lion Henson. Boss Lion 
Simmons called on former Boss Lion 
Winsor who announced that the 
Lions vests had arrived for the 
members who had ordered them. 
Lion Winsor reminded us about our 
broom sale on April 29th. Boss Lion 
Simmons mentioned a request tor 
eye glasses which the club had 
received. Meeting adjourned.

“Don’t shortchange 
yourself on your 
tax refund.’’

—  Henrv Block

A t H&R Block, w e  guarantee 
you the biggest refund you have 
com ing, or your return is FREE. 
Don’t settle for less —  com e to 
H&R Block.

806-259-2714 

2201

H & R  B L O C K
THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE 

Memphis, TX 79245

W ALLPAPER
From 990 Single

Roll

JU S T ARRIVED!! 2 Truckloads of 
V.A. & Vinyl Floor Tile_______

Ceram ic
Floors

From Italy 840, -  $189SQ .
FT.

— THE ORIG INAL NO  WAX FLOOR—

I T H E ^ Hla CARPET 
GALLERY ■

2514 Georgia Amarillo, Texas 79109 (806) 358-8981 
— IN S TA LLA TIO N  AVAILABLE—

i
i

i
!
i
i
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CARE FREE CONDITIONS

TAKE A  CLOSE LOOK

According to the water quality 
council's estimate, hard water coats American 
consumers billions of dollars each year. 
Care Free conditioned water will solve these 
costly hard water problems easily and In­
expensively. In fact, all waters will be 
Improved by Care Free Conditioning.

Remember water has an effect on everything It 
touches, and water touches Just about every­
thing.

For Further Information Contact 
Your Area Dealer

IMPORTANT NOTICE
Realizing, that the OIL BUST has created a  financial strain on 
most residents of the Texas Panhandle, we at Heritage are 
taking the following steps to help easy that strain.

We are doing this for the following reasons.

1) to help the consumer
2) to increase business (naturally!!)

and
3) in hope that OTHER BU SIN ESSES  

W ILL DO TH E S A M E  so that 
TO GETHER W E  CAN  BU ILD  BA CK  
A STRONG ECO NO M Y!

D A N N Y  ASKEW
Rt. 1 874-5001 
Clarendon, Texas 79226

CELEBRATE THE
T exas SESQumnENNiAL
WITH THE 1986-1987 *

TEXAS ALMANAC
1n the new T E X A S  ALM ANAC, you’ll discover

more than 750 pages of everything you ever wanted to 
know about the Lone Star State. The 1986-1987 edition 
names the 25 most important figures in Texas history 
and reviews the events that shaped Texas’ destiny. 
These special features, plus regional facts, make this 
"Encyclopedia of Texas” the perfect reference for 
Texas' 150th birthday celebration.

The 1986 87 T E X A S  A LM A N A C  is available where 
fine books are sold. Paperbound, $8.95; hardbound, 
$14.95. Or use the form below to order by mail.

EFFECT IVE  IM M ED IA T ELY :
(until further notice)

Our PARTS DEPT. ( Parts & Accessories)
Will D EC R EA SE  prices BY 10% 
on all retail cash sales,

Our SER V ICE  DEPT
Will D EC R EA SE  the COST OF LABOR C H A R G ED  
and PARTS U SED  for all retail cash customers by 
BY 10%

C inclosed is my check or money order fo r--------
Paperbound copies of the Texas Almanac at $11.25 each
______Hardbound copies al $17.62 each, which includes
tax, packaging and postage lo any point in the U.S.A.

Nam e_______________________

Address _____,_____________

CityZip-----------------------------------------— ------------
Mail lo: Texas Almanac Division, The Dallas Morning News, 

Comniumealions Center, Dallas. TX 75265

Pulili>li)\l lnr nniri' lti.ii ,i u  nlury In

Gfyr Dallas ptorning r̂tos

W here  P ride  M a k e s  The D iffe re n ce ’*

Local Agent Office Supply

A M G
JEEP

R E N A U L T

M ER C U RY

L IN C O L N
M i l  » V l b f  U M l i W N  P A M H A  I f X A b  7yo»>t> 

I l L t l ’M U N l  UUt* OUb 04  U 4

F O R D

LINCOLN
MERCURY



Fresh from the Farm now being sold daily at 
your local IGA Foodliner Store and fried fresh 
daily at Greenbelt Motel. Pick up orders only. 
Call ahead 874-9979.

Specia] of the Week April 15-19

Perms $27.50 '
Includes shampoo/set and haircut

Gel Nails $15.00

Complimentary Skin Analysis 
Facials $7.00

For Information call 874-2445 
Ask for Leslie or Mary

2701 Paramount 
Amarillo. 358-2457 
Mastercard and Visa Welcon

ef$ get ft together, 
buckle

ALDERSON
CHEVROLET

PnR*1

Caprice Classic Brougham

Unshrunk. Unspoiled. 
Uncompromised.

■V '■ \

While some full-size cars are downsizing. Caprice Classic 
remains uncompromised, with one of the longest wheel­
bases of any luxury sedan. This year, Caprice is even more 
luxurious with the addition of a new Brougham interior. 
Caprice's rear drive parallels that of the world's most 
desirable luxury sedans, like Mercedes Benz and BMW, and 
provides for a smooth ride plus exceptional tow ing power.
And Caprice Classic is one of the few cars today that still 
boast the road isolation of a full-perimeter frame. When 
you can get all this room and comfort for a surprisingly 
comfortable price, why compromise* CAPRICE CLASSIC.
THE UNCOM PROM ISED AM ERICAN CLASSIC

7 . 9 %  APR for 31 to 36 months or 8 . 9 %  APR for 37 to
48 months on Caprice. On other Chevrolet cars 
and light duty tracks, rates vary boas 0.9% to 
10.9% APR dap ending  an finance term and model

A r io la s  honored  on 50th 

ann ive rsa ry
The children o f Mr. and Mrs. 

G.W. (Pete) Ariola honored them 
with a 50th wedding anniversary 
celebration Easter Sunday, March 
30. The celebration took place at 
Brice in the home o f their son and 
daughter-in-law Bruce and Kath­
erine Ariola. Helping with the 
occasion were Mr. and Mrs. Ariola’s 
other children, Shirley Roberts and 
LaJuana Tucker o f Clarendon and 
Elly Gillespie o f Grapevine. They 
had a delicious lunch served and

Robert, LaJuana, Scott and Doug 
Tucker o f Clarendon, Lois Ariola, 
Susie M iller, Mildred Ariola o f 
Memphis, Son and Evelyn Ariola o f 
Amarillo, Bea Gann of California, 
Norman, Alice, and Tony Gann of 
Brice, Ann Byars, of Lakeview, R.D. 
and Fay Revell of Lakeview and 
Linda Nowing of Dallas.

, April 1 7 ,19M

Schools (A .C .E .), randomly selected 
from 44 states, averaged between 
one and two grade levels above the 
average public school pupil in the 
California Standard Achivem ent 
Test.

Nationwide, the number q f 
Christian schools has grown from 
several hundred in the I960! to more 
than 10,000 today, with dose to a 
million students enrolled. And the 
number o f students is growing by 

80,000 a year.

Late Edition 
M eets

catered by Son and Evelyn Ariola of 
E&S Market in Amarillo. Because of 
the beautiful weather, lunch was 
served outside. Then the honorecs 
and guests were invited inside for a 
lovely reception o f cake and punch.

Family and friends enjoyed a 
relaxed afternoon o f visiting. Those 
attending were Bruce, Katherine,. 
SuLynn and James Ariola o f Brice, 
Shirley Roberts, Larry, Tammy, 
Misti and Corey Ledbetter o f Claren­
don. Elly Gillespie o f Grapevine,

CHRISTIAN SCHOOL STUDENTS 
FAR AHEAD -

Students at private Christian 
schools test one to two years higher 
than students in public schools, 
according to a recent study.

In 1984, more than 7,000 students 
in Accelerated Christian Education

The Late Edition Home Extension 
met Tuesday evening at Fust 
& Trust hospitality room.

The program was a demonstration 
of porcelain-effect miniatures ably 
presented by member Ruby Jewel 
Hardin. She displayed many o f her 
creations made from the china day, 
salt clay and bread dough mixtures.

Ten members were present and 
enjoyed a hands-on experience creat­
ing miniature roses. The group 
meets on 2nd Tuesdays each month.

HowardwickIlf

Friendship
Club

Howardwick Friendship Club will 
have a covered dish supper, Friday, 
April 18, at Howardwick City Hall.

Chamberlain 
Community

Chamberlain Community 
will have a covered dish supper, 
Friday, April 18, at 7 p.m. Everyone 
is invited to come and enjoy in the 
fun and games. Bring a friend.

Burn-out
shower 
scheduled for 
Vernons

lhe Clarendon Fuebelles and the 
Clarendon Volunteer Fire Depart- 
will host a burn-out shower for Mr. 
and Mrs. Russell Vernon on Sunday, 
April 20th, at the Fire Station from 
2:00 to 4:00 p.m. The Vernons’ home 
was completely destroyed, and they 
are in need of everything.

Please join us in helping the 
Vernons get a fresh start.

Greenbelt Electric Cooperative

ANNUAL
MEMBERSHIP

MEETING
A p r il  25, 1986

Bura Handley Community Center 
in Wellington

R egistration................... 1:30 p.m.
Business Meeting......... 2:00 p.m.

• Election of 2 Directors 
• Drawing for Attendance Prizes 

• Refreshments

Women's Fashion

PERSONAL SERVICE:

FASHION COUNSELING 
PROPER FITTINGS 

WARDROBE UPDATING

Take A  Bite O ut O f
TAXES W ith An IRA From 

Vernon Savings

12-24 Month
9.65 %10.28% Fixed Rate IRA

Current Interest Rate Annual Effective Yield S100 Minimum Deposit
, *■ • Comp>unded Daily

Additions of at least tl(K) allowed without extending maturity

VERNON
SAVINGS A: I OAN

MI MHIK INI K

419 Snath 6th Street Memphis Tv 79245 |Ki#M £59 t>77 
OTHf R O f  Mi l s

Vrnruvn T\ Dfrila* IV Children IV ftitlucah IV Wu hint tiflF IV AuMiti IV Kk harvHitVi ’IV Irrtlcntk Ok

V.

I
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! * • » . .  April 17, 1986

a Share

(we) would like to ‘Own a Share of History’ with my
[our) donation of $ -----------------to the Saints’ Roost
Museum for membersnip indicated.

□  $5,000 Founding Saint □  $ 100 Apprentice Saint
□  $1,000 Patron Saint □  $ 25 Booster Saint
□  $ 500 Saint □  $ 10 Novice Saint
□  $ 250 Aspiring Saint □  Other_____________ __

All memberships are cumulative over a 10 year 
period and income tax deductible.

Signed by

Please make checks payable to Saints’ Roost 
Museum and mcM with this form to Box 123, 
Clarendon, Tx. 7922b.

Chicken rolled in powdered milk insteed of flour, will fry 
to e golden brown.

Coming
Obituaries

Funeral services for George Gor­
don Bain, 82, o f Turkey, were held 
Friday morning at 11:00 a.m. April 
11, 1986 in the First United Metho­
dist Church at Turkey with the 
pastor, the Rev. Dennis Flaugher 
and the Rev. Johnny Williams, a 
retired Methodist minister from 
Lubbock, officiating. Burial followed 
in the Dreamland Cemetery at Tur­
key, under the direction o f the 
Schooler Gordon Funeral Directors of 
Turkey. .  v

Gordon passed away In the 
M ethodist H ospital in Lubbock 
around noon on April 9 after a 
lengthy illness. He was born In 
Rowe, Texas on February 12, 1904, 
a son ot the late James and Kate 
Bain. He lived in Clarendon until he 
left for the New Mexico Military 
Institute. He was married to 
Marjorie Walters in 1930 in Tulia. 
He farmed for a while and then went 
to work for Federal Aviation where 
he worked until he retired and came 
to Turkey and he and Marjorie 
bought the Turkey Hotel which he 
continued to run at the time o f his 
death. He was an active member of 
the Methodist Church and the 
Masonic Lodge. He is survived by 
his wife Marjorie, one son Navarre 
Bain of Odessa; one daughter Mrs. 
Jinna Sue Turner o f Lockney; two 
brothers J.L. Bain o f Pam pa and 
Woodrow Bain o f Baytown; two 
sisters Mary Helen Boston of Pampa 
and Viola Howell o f Seymour; eight 
grandchildren and ten great grand­
children.

Pallbearers were Mike Smith, 
John Grady, Gene Fuston, Keith 
Green, Cody Bril, U.F. Coker Jr., 
Billy Farley an Grady Tyler.

MopoRub

have reunion

The 1935-36 class o f Clarendon 
College will meet for a Dutch lunch at 
11:30 to 12 noon Saturday, April 26, 
at the Country Kitchen. Members 
bring your spouses.

Addresses o f all class members are 
not available so please pass this 
information along to any you may 
know.

Robert Nichols o f Denton has 
talked with several classmates who 
plan to be present. I f you graduated 
with this class, attended college or 
were a high school senior with this 
group and would like to visit and 
renew acquaintances, please feel 
free to join them at the Kitchen.

For further inform ation, call 
George Wayne Estlack, 806-874-2043 
or 806-874-3606.

Many are expected to be in 
Clarendon April 26-27 for the annual 
reunion o f Clarendon College exes. 
Casses to be recognized this year are 
the Cass o f 1935-36 marking their 
50th anniver try. and the Cass o f 
1961.

Mennen



WTU to refund more 

than $9 million

A M  17, 19M

West Texas Utilities Co. has 
received permission from the Public 
Utility Commission o f Texas to 
reftind more than 99 million in over­
collected fuel costs to its retail

The PU C s action was in response 
to a request filed March 17 by WTU. 
The total amount to be refunded 
includes 99,146,092 in actual fuel 
costs savings which have accum­
ulated since the current fuel rate for 
WTU was set by the PUC last 
August, plus 9215,837 in interest.

The /efunds will be made through 
one-time credits on bills customers 
will receive in May. The typical 
customer should receive about 822.

Also approved was W TU’s pro­
posal to reduce its fuel rates, tech­
nically known as the Interim Quar­

terly Fixed Fuel Factor, for the 
three-month period beginning in 
May. WTU officials estimate that 
fuel charges to customers will drop 
by 8.2 percent during that period. 
Base rates for kilowatt-hours used 
have not changed since 1984 and will 
remain the same.

W TU’s fuel costs have declined for 
two years in a row, largely due to a 
softening natural gas market. Utility 
companies are allowed to pass the 
fuel costs to customers. Adjustments 
fo r over-collections or under- 
collections formerly were made auto­
matically each month, but since 1983 
utilities in Texas have collected fuel 
costs through fixed factors, which 
have necessitated refunds. This will 
be W TU’s second refund within a 
year.

T ^ rn r.

Whan washing sqnaky toys put adhesive over the open 
ing to hoop water out during cleaning.

DOUG SEAL
' F O R  U. S. C O N G R E S Si

>•1. ad. paid *o» by DOUG SCAL FO« CO N G RESS COMMITTEE.
Janie* Duncan. Treasurer 1701 Corsicana SI.. WaMneton. Teaas 790*5

| A D A M S '
DAY C A M  ClNTB
OPENING APRIL

Licensed - quality care 
18 months and up

810 Gorst
Taking Enrollments Now

874-3283

Mr. and Mrs. BUI Clubb o f Hedley 
announce the engagem ent and 
approaching m arriage o f their 
daughter Deborah Kay Clubb to

KeUy Joseph Martin, son o f Mr. and 
Mrs. Brace Martin o f White Deer. 
The coupk plans to be married on 
May 3 in the Hedley Church o f Christ 
st 6:00. All friends are invited.

CC holds intramural rodeo
The Clarendon College Spring 

Intramural Rodeo was blessed with 
sunshine, little wind, and s crowd o f 
enthusiastic entrants and supporters 
Saturday afternoon. This rodeo is 
open to college students and exes. 
This event is coordinated by Kelvin 
Sharp, Rodeo PE instructor and the 
Rodeo Club.

Events and winners were:
Bareback riding • 1st Donny 

McNeil, Viri. OK; 2nd John McKee, 
Chimney Rock, Colo.; 3rd Aaron 
Koehler. Woodward, OK.

Barrel race - 1st Angie Elmore, 
Allison; 2nd Kye Grau, Grady, NM; 
3rd Lyssa Brooks, Borger.

Saddle Brones - 1st BUlie Billings­
ley, McLean; 2nd LeRoss Apple, 
Kenton, OK; 3rd John McKee.

Rescue Race • 1st Stave Gaillard, 
Texhom a; Carol Brandenberger, 
Llano; 2nd Stiver Sisneros, Santa 
Rosa, NM and Angie Elmore; 3rd 
Steve Gaillard and Haley Clark, 
Miami.

Bull Riding • 1st Btonc Otis, 
Canadian; 2nd Chris Downer, 
Clarendon; 3rd Brad Powell, Boys 
Ranch.

Hide Pull - 1st Steve Gaillard and 
Chris Downer; 2nd Mike Leyba, 
Quemado, NM and Chris Downer; 
Shawn Farrar and o f Clarendon and 
Jigger McKinley, Pietown, NM.

Steer saddling • 1st Stiver and 
Frank Sisneros and Kevin Vineyard, 
St. Vrain, NM; 2nd Lee Wilcox, 
Fairview. OK. Keith Hight. Lockney, 
and Brock Crockett, McLean; 3rd-" 
Larry Rush, Melrose, N., Tommie 
Thompson, McAlister, NM, and 
Warren Metzger, Estancia, NM.

Ribbon roping - 1st Kevin Vine­
yard and Missy McKinley, Pietown; 
2nd Phillip Jiron, Boxque Farms, 
NM and Jana Montgomery, Mem­
phis. 3rd Jigger and Missy McKin­
ley.

Calf dressing - 1st Becky Wieck, 
Dumas, Sug and Missy McKinley; 
2nd Kylene Guthrie, Lubbock, Kim 
Form way, Clarendon, and Carol 
Brandenberger.

Team roping • 1st Phillip and 
Wayne Jiron, 2nd Shawn Farrar and 
Jigger McKinley.

Steer riding • 1st Tiki Jackson. 
Spearman, 2nd Diane Cupp, Logan, 
OK.

Faculty ribbon roping • 1st Phillip

Jiron and Tex Selvidge, Dean o f 
Students, 2nd Shawn Farrar and 
Kelvin Sharp, PE and Math in-\ 
struct or, 3rd Shawn Dennis and Kris 
Harris, Cafeteria Manager.

Local ACS

services
available

The American Cancer Society in 
Donley County announced that it has 
a variety o f services available to 
cancer patients without charge.

"Many people are unaware o f all 
the services we can provide right 
here in this town," said A.R. 
Henson, service chairman. "A nd all 
that is required in moat cases is 
written permission from tire patient’s 
physician."

Loan equipment such as hospital 
beds, wheel diairs, commode chain 
and walken are available as well as 
expendable hems inducting dress­
ings, hospital gowns, bed pads, 
pillows and other Hems.

"These are all in addition to our 
basic inform ation and referra l 
services," said Henson. "And,

NORTH AMERICAN SUPPLY CO.
riamhlnQ .★  W iring ★  Hnotlng A  A ir  Conditioning 

*  Repairs A  Now Constroction 
S ta to A C H y  Usconsodfor9 0 years 

Bonded A  Insured
RODDY KUNNKRT 

AT 874-2642

to Recovmy for mas- 
tectomees, esophageal speech les­
sons for laryngectomees, ostomy 
rehabilitation and related patient and 
family support groups.”

The concept for these rehabili­
tation programs is the voiunteer-to- 
patient relationship," added Hen­
son. “ W e have many volunteers who 
are themselves former patients and 
who are specifically trained by the 
Society to help other patients and 
even their families adjust to living 
with cancer."

Henson cited that when most 
people think o f the American Cancer 
Society, they relate the name to 
cancer research. “ While it Is true 
the ACS funds millions o f dollars for 
cancer research, we are also a 
community-based organization pro­
viding many local services. These 
patient services as well as education 
materials o f all types are just a few o f 
the ways we can help."

Anyone needing more information 
on these services may contact A.R. 
Henson.

J F iF

Ik s a was one 3/404 fast 
I in Now York in 1983.

YOUR VOTE & INFLUENCE WILL BE APPRECIATED

W ILLIAM  CH AM BERLA IN
CAND ID ATE FOR RE-ELECTION

C O U N T Y  C O M M IS S IO N E R  

PR E C IN C T  NO. 4  
D O NLEY CO U NTY 

PAID PO« IT WltllAM CHAMBERLAIN

SUBJECT TO ACTION Of The DEMOCRATIC PRIMARY

HEALTHY PEOPLE NEED  

GOOD HEALTH  

INSURANCE TO O
»S tK

1. ) A re  you paying high prem ium s and

subsidizing sick people?

2. ) A re  you tired of no local service?

3. ) If your answ er w as yes to any of
the above

W E OFFER A N  EXCELLENT 
HEALTH PRODUCT WITH A  
$2,000,000 M A X  BENEFIT!

laition

Call ® N O R P P
InsurantIn s u r a n c e  A g e n c y , J n c\

806-874-3521

For Further Details or Com e 8y O u r Office

Call

m aoaoeoem D O eeooeeeooeoooooeoc
BOOOOOOOOPr  onrnj

VIRNIE FORD REDI MIX
g p t u W j s p e c i a l

Anv concrete |ob with as much as 500 sq. tt. I will do for *1.75 
per ft. for complete Job. I do forming, finishing and concrete.

W e do cellars, patios, driveways and etc.

Free Estimates
874-2751 or 874-2370

Call Anytime

40* Storage Vans — Excellent Shape

Roll-up Rear Doors 
Can install side door very easy

Delivery
Service

Available

Also several other Storage Vans in stock
,

10 sets of
1 5 "  Heavy Duty Lowboy Tandum Axle Units

OWENS SALVAGE CO„ INC.
806/447-2581 Wellington, Texas

i



Classified ad rates are $3.50 for 15 
words or less, 10 cents per word over 
15 words. Card of thanks, average 

'« length, is $4.00. Subscription rate in 
Donley County is $11.00 plus 56c tax 

, yearly. Subscriptions for out of 
Donley County is $14.00 plus 72c tax 
yearly. Out of state subscriptions are 
$14.00 yearly. Six month subscrip- 

, tions are $6.50 plus 33c tax. Three 
month subscriptions are $5.00 plus 
26c tax. Display ads on request.

A  $1 charge win be added if 
statements ate sent on classified ads. 
If you want your classified ad 

'  blocked, there will be an additional 
$1 charge on the first ad.

DONNA’S ALL M E E D  
DOG GROOMING  

248-3691 GROOM, TEXAS

STEVE’S AUTOMOTIVE 
INDUSTRIAL ENGINES

Per

874-3446

CAUL YOUR LOCAL USED COW  
DEALER

Par Dead Stock Removal 
1-860-692-4043 

Toll Free
HEREFORD BI-PRODUCTS

M EM PHIS SINGER 
SEW ING MACHINE  
SALES A  SERVICE

Far contacts call

I am ini

W E  NO W  HAVE I 
> at JAW  i

i ovary two weeks

34-tfe

CLARENDON LODGE #700AF/AM

7.30 p.m.
let

RayJs
s, W .M . 
etaa, See 
served at 6t30

FOR SALE* 1-4 year old registered 
„  ^  1;1 year old

registered LongHorn cow.
*  r ^  12-tfc

AL MORRAH SHRINE CLUB 
Beard of Directors meet let Tuesday, 
each month, First Baak A  Treat 

Beam, 7:30 p.m. The 
every 3id Monday, 7:30

p.m.,
IMIy Ray
H.H . Rodaera. Vice-Pieakient

Secretary

FOR SALE 
Honaes la CUrendan, Hadley and 
Howardwkk. Call ns, we need 
listings 874-2533.

SANDERS REAL ESTATE 
720 S. McClelland 

874-2533

CLARENDON CABLE TV 
“ There’s More to See on Cable TV’’ 

Phone 874-2522
2 W GN • Movies, Sports
3 WTBS • Movies, Sports
4 NBC • Amarillo Network
5 ESPN • Sports
6 PTL - Religions
7 KFDA • Amarillo Network
8 ACTS - Baptist Network
9 CNN • News
10 CBS - Amarillo Network
11 CBN - Movies and Religion
12 PBS - 1
13

WATSON BACKHOE  
Contact Larry 874-2178

FOR SAI£t 3 bedroom. 2 bath, all 
electric brick home, cellar and two 
out buUdings. Howardwick area. 
Also 1 lot on Hwy 70 North. 
First Bank A  Trust 806-874-3556. 
Contact Jim Garland.

2-tfc

FOR SALE: 60 acres at Quail. 
Call 817-725-7766.

9-tfc

TAKE UP PAYM ENTS ON 2 A  3 
BEDROOM HOMES 

Qualify by Phans
806-381-3152

HOUSE FOR SAIEt 606 S. Sims. 3 
bedroom, 1 bath, kitchen, dining 
room, living room, doable garage, 
1V4 blocks from school, large yard. 
J.B. Lane.

-2tp

CREDIT PROBLEMS?
DOW N PAYM ENT PROHLEMSO 

For sincere help eaR 381-1352, call

WATSON BROTHERS 
CUSTOM FARMING  

Hay Bailing - Square or Round 
Contact Faylon 874-3770 

Larry 874-2178
14- 4tp

FOR SALE 
810 Hawley

2-bedroom, 1V4 bath, large living 
area with Ben Franklin wood burner, 
utility room, new panelling and new 
carpet throughout, on three lots with 
fruit trees and plenty of garden 
space. Owner will finance with 
reasonable down payment. Contact 
Robert Waggoner at Gibson’s Meat 
Market, 874-3524 - home phone 
874-3846.

15- 4tc
FOR SALE: 2 bedroom furnished 
mobile home. See to appreciate, 
$4850. Also 14’ fiberglass boat, no 

874t2SB3_______ ___________ -
15-2tc

FOR SALE: 23,000 BTU refrigerated
air conditioner $75.00,1 set gas logs, 
used five times $65.00. 515 W . 6th 
St. Call 874-3158.

M AGIC W AND  CARPET 
CLEANING COM PANY  

Stow 1971
W e d s  

W eaae

3 ACRES FOR SALE across highway
from college. Edward Dill 718- 
759-4338, Munster, Texas.

14-3tp

W ANTED
200-320 acres of grassland, with or 
without house, good fences and 
water. Garner Real Estate. 874-2330 
Clarendon. Texas.

14-tfc

BAILEY’S
WELDING A  W INDM ILL SERVICE

Bax 522
McLean, Texas 79057 

806-779-2255 day ar night
14- 4tp

I WOULD LIKE TO DO LA W N  and 
yard work. See at 928 W . 5th or call 
874-2251.

15- 2tp

FOR SALE: Fresh sausage, 2 lb. pkg 
for $4.00. Call Derek Howard,
874-3276.

16- ltp
THANK YOU

I want to thank everyone for the 
cards, flowers, phone calls, viaitings 
and kindness shown during my stay 
in the hospital.

H .L. Tipton 
16-ltc

HALF PRICE! Flashing arrow signs
$2991 Lighted, non-arrow $2791 

Nonlighted $229! Free letters! 
Only few left. See locally. 1(800) 
423-0163, anytime.

16-ltp
RESPONSIBLE PERSON  

Wanted to own and operate candy 
vending route. Pleasant business 
with high profit items. Can start part 
time. Cash investment of $3996 to 
$12,996. Call 1-800-328-0723.

EAGLE INDUSTRIES 
26 Years of Service

16-ltp

W ANT TO M EET Persian nuie cat. 
purpose, brief encouter (romance), 
874-3287.

16-ltp
COLORADO M OUNTAINS  

40 acres, snow-capped views, forrest 
hunting, dose to skiing, excellent 
access. S450/acre. low down. Dan 
Dansby, 303-574-2615 days, 303-528- 
5325 nites/wknds.

16-4tc

M UST SELL rental property in 
McLean. $600 month income. 
$6,500 cash or $1,500 down, owner 
carry balance. 806-256-5372.

16-2tp
FOR SA ID : 9.7 acres with large 2 
bedroom, 1 bath home on 2 lots, 
screened front porch, carport, store 
rooms, concrete cellar, lots of pecan, 
fruit trees. 6 blocks from town. Call 
874-2694 after 8 p.m.

16-4to

FOR FULLER BRUSH PRODUCTS, 
call Peggy Legate In Claude at
226-2053.

16-4tp
FOR SAIEt 3 bedroom with bath, air 
conditioner, fireplace, central heat, 
garage and storage, Greenbelt Lake. 
806-874-2764.

16-4tp

FOR RENT: 4 room and bath 
apartment, water bill paid. Call 
874-2857 after 5:00.

16-ltp

TH ANK  YOU
I would like' to express my sincere 

appreciation to all the voters of 
Donley County who supported and 
voted for me for Trustee on the 
Clarendon ISD Board.

Johnny Floyd 
16-ltc

RAY'S
APPLIANCB

W e service all i

Freexer A  Refrlgeratfon Service 
A Repairs

i, TX 79226 
874-3801

Far a free i > call 874-2416.
12-tfc

FOR SALE: baby chicks and baby 
ducks at White’s Feed and Seed.

16-ltc

LEWIS W ELL SERVICE 
Hedky, Texas 

856-4831 
I Sendee - Pumps

fast , dependable  r e pa ir  service  

t v s  —  RADIOS —

TEX’S TV  SERVICE
TIX NAYLOR. OWNIR

1413 West 5th Street Hr. 806 874-2561
ROUTE 1 CLARENDON, TEXAS 79226

16-3tp

BOYS BMX FREE SPIRIT 20”  bike, 
good shape, $40. 874-5000.

16-ltc
LAW N M OW ING

Air:
874-3185 after 6 iM ’

1 « * P

Bailey Estes A  Sen
Welding Fabricating & Steel Building* 

- nl*o *e!f storage unit* for 

BEMT '25 " month

J  A  J  W ILD IN G  SER VICI
CvstGRi W«ldlR| off all typos 

Highway 70 Sooth
•poa  Monday-Satarday A a.m. • A p.m, 

•74-2794 Day S74-2S04 Night

TERM ITE PROBLEMS
CaM for best termite control 3608 N.E. 23rd
Over 20 years experience 

Call coded 383-7075
, Texas 79107 

State Lk. No. 1178

LKO RUSSELL

FOR SALE: I gun cabinet for 6 guns 
with sliding glass doors, two storage 
doors, three drawers. 2 new book­
cases. Call 874-3286.

16-ltc
W A NT TO BUY a reasonably recent 
set of encyclopedias for classroom. 
Call £74-2391 after 6 p.m.

16-ltp
EASY ASSEM BLY W ORK!

$714.00 per 100. Guaranteed pay­
ment. No sales. Details -  Send 
stamped envelope: ELAN-5230,
3418 Enterprise, Ftpierce, FL 33482.

!6-4tp
TH ANK  YOU

Words can never express our 
gratitude to everyone who helped us 
during the fire and since. our 
wonderful neighbors and friends who 
stayed by our sides and did every­
thing they possibly could, for all the 
prayers, fowl, clothing, we will be 
eternally grateful. W e have always 
been aware that Clarendon is the 
best place in the world to live and 
work because of our citizens here, 
but until now, I’m sorry to say, we 
did not realize what an outstanding 
fire department we have. They are 
extremely well trained, arrived with­
in minutes and fought as hard as they 
could, knowing the odds were 
against them from the moment they 
arrived. But what gave them a 
special place in our hearts were the 
hugs, apologies, and heartsick looks 
in their eyes because they were 
unable to save anything. A  special 
THANKS to this really fine group of 
men and to everyone who volun­
teered their time and help during our 
time of need. Our prayers were 
answered when none of them were 
injured. Thank you and God bless all 
of you.

Russell and Betty Vernon 
Rkk and Pat Rattan

16-ltp

THE ALPHA UPSILON EPSILON 
Chapter of Beta Sigma PM n r — By 

iy 40 beats af p e a s

the buffet In the dining ream an 
March 24, 1906. W e wean going to 

tablee to one at eur

donated theae eut a f their 
ewn stamps. If yen saw theae ar 
know anything about theae pteaee 
contact Triah Floyd 874-3324 ar Ftas 
Mooring at 874-2218 after five 
o’clock. W e would ae ranch ap-

FOR SALE: weaner pigs. Call
873-3814.

LAM PS, SHADES,

HOUSE OFSHADES  
A LAM P REPAIRS 

2613 W olflla, Ave., WoURn V  
>,TX 79109

Denise's
Cloth Shop
O pen
9:00 a.m.- 5:30p.m. 
C losed Sun. & Tues.

C f r a m 6 f i / i £ c u n M OTOR C O M P A N Y

HIGHWAY 287 CLARENDON. TEXAS 
8UICK • OLDSMOBILE 

PONTIAC • CADILLAC • GMC TRUCKS

FRED CLIFFORD 
Home PhoiM 

(806) 174-24 IS

Ctemaon (806) $74 3627 
Amrtto 376-8041 

IM S  MATS (800) 682 4088

REFRIGERATION 
AIR CONDITIONING A  
HEATING
Sm all Commercial refrigeration 

DAVID W. SMIILDS 474-2539

C f r a m 6 j e / i 6 c u n  M OTOR C O M P A N Y

HIGHWAY 287 CLARENDON, TEXAS 
BUICK • OLDSMOBILE 

PONTIAC • CADILLAC • GMC TRUCKS

OARELL HARPER 
074-3007

\allmn e s y l a c k

i tbs a va ila b ility  af 
Sven lag

i

B y  A ppointmants 209-0181 
1644 N 18th Memphis 
South of the Hoapltal________

Electrical and Appliance Repair 
Call 874-3683 Box 5%
Sanded a  Llcaaiad

h"/, .

Brown-McMurtiy Implement ^
PHOKE106-823-2441 '

BOX 777
S1LVE8TON. tEXAS 79257 

DON MNOWN CLARENCE W ARD!
Ilimu Fh. 823-2292 Hume Ph. 823-2083 f

ff*. Scales
Clarendon Orate 
Elevators, Inc.

J.R , Gill
P.Q. Bex 805

v Clarendon, Tax. 79226 
874-3172
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Local dog fanciers to 

compete at American

Kennel Club shows

i l l

■ta. vitamins (oopociaMy A  and

TODD STAVENHAGEN k LOOUPY

K-9 Korp Kapers

By JUAN KODR1GUEZ
We would like to welcome two new 

dogs to our Korp, Webster the 
Wizzsrd and Looupy.

Webster is a West Highland White 
Terrier who was placed with Amy 
Koontz for the K-9 Korp by Helen 
Edwards o f Amarillo, who is owner of 
Sunset Pets.

Looupy is a German Spitz who was 
placed with Todd Stavenhagen, by 
Sherrie Moke o f Amarillo with the 
help o f Annette Brooks and the 
Animal Rights Association. The 
Association helps find good homes

RICKY RATTAN 
Owaer/Scrvfce Tech.

for dogs and other animal*
The K-9 Korp is very fortunate to 

have this opportunity o f training 
these two purebred AKC (American 
Kennel Club) registered dogs, and is 
very grateful.

Anyone who would like to place a 
dog with one o f our kids could call 
our dog project leader Judy McCully 
at 874-3419.

W e would like to thank Helen 
Edwards, and Sherrie Moke for 
placing these dogs with Amy and 
Todd.

SALES k SERVICE

Hatton *7. V. Se/uAica
AFTER THE SALE, IT'S SERVICE THAT COUNTS

CABLE TV

OFFICE - HOME 
(8061 874-2522

EM - 2 WAY COMMUNICATIONS 
Satellite Service k Sales

BOX 912
CLARENDON, TEXAS 79226

Donley County will be well repre­
sented at the upcoming American 
Kennel Club Dog Shows to be held 
Saturday and Sunday at the Tri-State 
Fairgrounds Rex Baxter Building, 
10th and Grand Avenue at'Xmarillo. 
Show hours are 7:00 a.m. to 7:00 
p.m. April 19. and 8:00 a.m. to 7:00 
p.m. April 20.

There are 917 dogs entered in the 
Panhandle Kennel Club Show Satur­
day with a total o f 958 entries. 
Judges are coming from California, 
Colorado, Oklahoma, Pennsylvania, 
Maryland, Missouri and Texas. 
Heart o f the Plains Kennel Club will 
have 945 dogs entered with a total o f 
984 entries. Sunday’s judges will 
come from Missouri,. Maryland, 
G eorgia, Oklahoma, Colorado, 
Pennsylvania, California and Texas.

The Dog Show (unbenched) and 
Obedience Trial will begin at 9:00 
Saturday with judging to start at 8:30 
Sunday.

Local 4-H K-9 Korp members 
entered in the shows are Elizabeth 
McAnear, Jenifer Davis, Steven 
Davis, Shannon Myers, Scott Myers, 
Juan Rodriguez, and Michael Moore. 
Judy McCully, Tiny Alderson, Bob 
and Vera Andis, Max Rodriguez and 
Brenda Rodriguez are also com­
peting.

Elizabeth will be showing her 
Labrador R etriver Lady Bronco 
Ebony McFritter in the Breed Ring 
and also in the Novice Jr. Show­
manship Competition (age 10-13). 
Jenifer will be handling Border Collie 
Benjamin Ringo in the Novice A 
Obedience competition trying for 
their second leg toward the com­
panion dog title. Steven with Toy

YOUR VOTE & INFLUENCE WILL BE APPRECIATED

• W . R. “BILLIE” CHRISTAL
CANDIDATB FOR (RE-ELECTION)

COUNTY JUDGE
DONLEY COUNTY

M. Pot MM By CnrtouiSe> rn.ClwaMwi.TM

SUBJECT TO ACTION Of The DEMOCRATIC PRIMARY

Oil-base paints can be re­
moved from the skin with 
plain baby oil.

3U5T
[LooriM*-

A T M*d

\\\ \ \ \ i v

The fastei  
greyhound.

We are now accepting applications 
for part-time employment.

Contact James or Lou at the office.

No phone calls will be accepted.

IGIBSOM1 Clarendon

Poodle Taffy ate also in Novice A. 
Shannon with Collie Myers Grand 
Dame Paddington and Scott with 
Collie Myers Lady Carmel Storm- 
cloud are entered in the Novice A 
ring. Juan and Australian Cattle Dog 
HIP-0 Bigfoot will be in the Novice B 
competition. Michael with Dober­
man Pinscher Baron Maxwell Von 
Schamann CD will be in Open A  
trying for the second leg toward the 
companion dog excellent title.

Judy McCully will be handling 
Doberman Pinscher Cavalier’s Ace- 
In-The-Hole in the American Bred 

-'Class. Michael Moore will show 
Doberman Pinscher Kimbertal’s Lieb 
Bonne’ Schon in the open black 
bitches class. Max and Brenda 
Rodriguez will be adding to the 
Novice B competition with Australian 
Cattle Dogs HIP-O Possum and 
HIP-0 Tallawong Tucson. Tiny 
Alderson with Miniature Schnauzer 
Karelyn’s Snickel Fritz are entered in 
Open A , M iniature Schnauzer 
Karelyn’s Schon Morgengrauen in 
the breed ring in the puppy class. 
Bob with H IP-0 Nutcracker, an 
Australian Cattle Dog will compete in 
Novice B Obedience and in the Open 
Open Breed Ring. Vera with CH 
HIP-0 Geronimo CD, an Australian 
Cattle Dog will be trying for the 
second leg in Open A  competition. 
She will also show HIP-O Ledoux 
Azucar in the Open Class competi­
tion in the breed ring.

Admission is free, and everyone is 
welcome. A dark green qualifying 
ribbon is given to each dog attaining 
a qualifying score. Beautiful 
trophies are awarded for various 
categories.

EMS Activity

04-07-86 Norma Jones, 55 of 
Clarendon from residence to High 
Plains Baptist Hospital, Amarillo. 
Medical.
. 04-09-86 Standby at structure fire 

at Vernon residence. Several fire­
fighters treated at scene for smoke 
inhalation. No transport.

04-10-86 Anne M. Price, 83 o f 
Clarendon from residence to High 
Plains Baptist Hospital. Amarillo. 
Medical,

04-12-86 Standby at college rodeo. 
No transport.

04-15-86 Ralph Hill. 55 o f Claren­
don no transport from residence. 
Medical.

04-15-86 Addierene MahafFey, 87 
o f Clarendon from residence to 
Gilkey Clinic, Clarendon and return 
to residence. Trauma.

79 responses handled in 1986 to 
date.

FIRE DEPARTMENT BUILDING 
FUND

Frank White Jr. and Garendon 
Hatchery.

Stanley and Elinor McKee in 
memory o f Stella Alexander.

Morris and Carol Hill in memory of 
Bill Todd and El bon Naylor.

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Noble.
Ray Burch family.
Gaude and Broadus Spivey and 

Spivey Ranch.
Clarendon F irebelles Ladies 

Auxiliary.
Lela M. Norton.

AD D IT IO N AL  EX EM PT IO N S  
M A Y  LO W ER YOUR TA XES!

If you have recently become 65 or disabled, you 
may qualify for additional property tax exemp­
tions on your homestead. Applications should be 
filed this year by May 1.

Farmers and ranchers who need to apply for 
productive valuation must do so by M»y l 
Applications are available at the Appraisal 
District office.

Further details about the property tax system in 
Texas and how it works for you are contained in a 
pamphlet by the State Property Tax Board called 
Taxpayers! Rights, Remedies, Responsibilities! 
Get a free copy at your Appraisal District office.

1 )NEB PRCT. 4 
I Chamberlain 

Dm  Crockett 
COUNTY TREASURER 

Freida Gray 

COUNTY JUDGE

W. R. (B illie) Christal 
Mrs. Dikki Howell

COUNTY CLERK

Denise Grady 
“  Vs..

FOR IA U
1 tan PS, PS, AC  

4 dear, PS, PB, AC
V* taa FU, PS, PB, AC  
Vi lea 4X4 

4X4
2 taa track

III

DANCE
‘WALTZ ACROSS TEXAS’ 

April 19,1986 
9:00 p .m .- 1:00 p.m.

Clarendon Community Cantor

Featuring

COUNTRY FEVER

$50#
par parson

Sat Ups and Snacks Included

Walts Contest 
1st, 2nd and 3rd places

Sponsored by A lpho Upslton Epsilon

W. (Dude) CORNUA 
R IA L M T A T I

OFFERING FOR SALE
-forva

PUCE - m  2 nice lata. C al m m  ta mo Ota
st

• 1
priced right at 812,M0. 

keree • 4 bdtai • 2 hath • I

3 bdrm, 2 M  bath brick beam ta woat

Hat. Owner has rodaced price. C a l Carol far

PO LITICAL more tnfomiattoa.

3-Bedroom Hoase, bath *  V », many alee
A N N O U N C EM EN TS feature caR Carol.

Political announcements appear­ 2 Bdrm -1  bath on 4 tats - *25,000, ewnsr v f l
ing in this column are subject to the ftaaace.
action o f the Democratic Primary,
May 3, 1986 All Announcements 168 acres wttb large 2 ataxy borne fret seatb sf
fcjf* must be paid in advance. Each Leila Lake aa pavement
announcement is paid by individual Large 2 story hares • 4 bdrm • 2 bath • Bring •
listed. (gulag . taa  • central beat/air • barereant -

JUSTICE OF PEACE PRCT. 2 doable car garage • 1 block frare school
W. W. (Bud) Lovelady 65/ec +  alee horee • owner woaM eoB horeo

JUSTICE OF PEACE PRCT. 3 +5/ac. separately.
M. O. Weatherly Nice meddler home oa ca re e r let - good

COMMISSIONER P IC T . 2 location - 2 or 3 bdrm - IV* baths - garage -

C. W. (Dude) Cornell atarre cedar. * v

•74-3*40 or 174-3141
FARMS

1 7 4 -l l t l
BROKER

Co td oH 474-3377 or 374-332R

<
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Food Buying Power
Grade “ A ”  FreshWhole

FRYERS
Owens Pure Pork

U.S. CHOICE (Bone-ln)

ROUND STEAK
SAUSAOB 1 Lb

Lb $ 0 5 7
2 Lbs

Lb

U.S. CHOICE

CHUCK ROAST
Fresh

OROUND BEEF
Chef Boyardee Complete With Meat 19.5 Oz Pkg

SPAOHETTI DINNER * 1 49
Betty Crocker Ass’ t A  _  h  a

HAMBURGER HELPER 1
Shurfine 46 Oz Can ^

TOMATO JUICE 8 9
Thrist Quencher 4 Pkg 16 Oz Bottles £

GATPRADE Ass'‘Fiavors |

U.S. CHOICE

ARM  ROAST
Fresh ___

BABY BEEF LIVER
Shurfine

^ APPLE BUTTER »o,,.
Betty Crocker Layer

m i

CAKE MIXES
Citrus Hill Frozen 12 Oz Can

ORANGE JUICE
Duncan Hines Soft

COOKIES » » .
Fresh

Assorted Pkg

$ | 0 *

wesson!
iW W V l

Large
Ex. Large

Doz

Ta s t y*  naYY a

PICKLES
. PIZZA
Del Monte 15V4 Oz can

Jenos Assorted

PIZZA I Each -̂4 48 Oz Bottle ... ..

Vlasic Bread & Butter Whole »  _  -  Pure Natural Corn 0l1 ^ — = * * * ' K  A  A

I  WESSON „ s u c i  »

PINEAPPLE 5 ^ *  PEPSI COLA
Lucky Loaf Apple Large 21 Oz can FRUIT DRINKS
PIE FILLING $ | « *  sJr r l -  ^  ____

—  7 * l i S I S L . $—
1 Lb Can IIBOItOlSSS'il I 1Shurfine Tomato 28 Oz Bottle

P, CATSUP 
I M i t

c o f f e e $3
f m
TOUCH aiUMM!

Shurfine 5 Lb Bag

Laundry Detergent 9 Lb 3 Oz Box

TIDE Family size 1
Price Saver Paper  ̂ Large ItolU -  Price Saver All Purpose ^ D l

------------  *  I M c ------ FLOUR
, , _  .«     r  \ Scott Luncheon ^

Dishwasher Detergent _ _  ^  _  p®ai<4i »  #  ___ k  ■ ■  V  f t

» 1 »  Ft! 11NAPKINS *»»■». 5 1 19ALL 35 Oz Box

Liquid Detergent
H  22 OzJOT Bottle

Charmin Bathroom

TISSUE iC * 1 ' * ___  ' i  i . •.

Purina

CAT CHOW
Snuggle

20 lb Bag

FABRIC SOFTNBR 40 Sheet Pkg

California Sunkist Navel

T  a p p l e s !  TOMATOES 1 SWEET
1 Washington i  California Vine Ripe ! POTATOES

Red Delicious *

California

BROCCOLI!
Maryland Sweet

Lb

Home Owned and Operated

Open Mon* - Sat.
Jack & Shirley Clifford 874-2425 Clarendon, Texas

7 A.M. • 7 P.M. Closed Sunday
Specials qood Wed. - Sat.


