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Th e  Am erican Legion A u x ilia ry  
Begins Mem bership D rive

Aubyn E. Clark Unit No. 128 of j r A L lk in kl
Clarendon, Texas is beginning an C A N N O N
intensive membership drive. Mrs. CELEBRATES 
Karl Adams is serving as chair- 89th BIRTHDAY
man with the following committee 
members: Mrs. Clarence Pipes, 
Mrs. Colie Huffman, Mrs. E. R. 
Andis.

If you are the mother, wife, 
daughter, or sister of a Legion­
naire or of a veteran who was 
killed in action or who has de­
parted this life you are eligible to 
the American Legion Auxiliary.

We are offering you a member­
ship in the American Legion Au­
xiliary today because you are the 
mother, wife, sister or daughter 
of a man who has served America 
in war; because you have exper­
ienced the pangs of anxiety for 
loved ondfe, the sacrifices and 
hardships which war brings to the 
families of the fighting men; be­
cause these experiences have 
made you value more highly the 
things for which our men have 
fought—are fighting — America 
and all that it means; and be­
cause we know that you desire to 
continue to serve, in war and in 
the peace that is to come, with 
them, our fighting men, for 
America.

Tor get a true beginning in the 
understanding of exactly what an 
Auxiliary membership means we 
must look back to the very start of 
the organization life. We find that 
the Auxiliary is an organization 
for the single purpose of serving. 
Nothing for self is contemplated. 
The purposes and aims of the or 
ganization lie outside of itself in 
som ethin bigger and of greater 
importance ”

The first and only purpose of 
the Auxiliary is to serve with the 
American Legion for America. All 
of its activities have this end in 
view. IV members have constant 
opportunity to go forward with 
the men of their families in pa­
triotic service given in the same 
spirit that the men served during 
World War I and are now serving 
in World War IL

Peace will come and the men of 
the armed forces will come home. 
They will add their- young 
strength to the mature power of 
the American Legion. Their moth­
ers, wives, sisters and daughters,

(See AUXILIARY, Page Eight)

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Moreland 
honored Mrs. Moreland’s father, 
Mr. J. F. Cannon, with a birthday 
dinner at their home October 10th, 
celebrating his 89th year, which 
was on October 8th.

Mr. Cannon has been a resident 
of Donley county since 1918. 
There are five sons and five 
daughters comprising his family. 
Six of them were present for the 
occasion.

Those to enjoy the celebration 
were Mrs. Hulda Wilson and Mrs. 
N. W. Durham and children Dan 
and Joan of Memphis, Mr. and 
Mrs. Milton Cannon and children 
Tommy, Jimmy and Jane of Ralls; 
Mr. and Mrg. Tick Barbee and son 
Keith of Goodnight; Mr. and Mrs. 
U. Z. Patterson and son Sammy, 
Mrs. Linnie Cauthen, Mr. and Mrs. 
Geo. Bulman and daughter Helen, 
Mr. Richard Cannon and son 
Frank, all of Clarendon.

TWO NEGRO BOYS FINED 
IN COUNTY COURT FOR 
MAIL ROBBERY

Two negro boys were assessed 
jail sentences and fined in county 
court last Friday before Judge 
R. Y. King for the stealing of mail 
from the Depot, where an accomo­
dation box is located for those 
who do not get to the Post Office 
before closing time.

One of the boys received 30 
days in jail, $10 fine and court 
costs. The other received 5 days in 
jail and $30 fine and court costs.

Both boys admitted taking as 
much as $55 in cash since the first 
of the year and the checks they 
found in letters were destroyed.

RUMMAGE SALE 
RESULTS

Rummage sales Field in town 
Saturday, Oct. 16 netted the fol 
lowing results:

The Women’s Society of the 
Christian Service of the Metho­
dist Church made $46.50.

The Win One S. S. Class of the 
Methodist Church took in $38.00.

The Presbyterian Auxiliary 
realized $56.00 from their sale.

The Episcopal Auxiliary made 
$40.00.

Proceeds from the** 
sales all go to worthy causes. Var­
ious articles and clothing contri­
buted by individuals ma)ces pos­
sible these sales.

P.-T. A. TO MEET
THURSDAY 28

•

The Parent-Teachers meeting 
will be held Thursday, October 
28th in the Junior High building 
at 3:45 p. m. All mothers are es­
pecially urged to be present as 
Miss Frey will talk on "Communi­
cable Diseases and Common 
Colds.”

Miss Frey, a highly trained 
nurse of St. Louis, is now holding 
the Home Nursing courses over 
the county. Miss Frey is doing 
a splendid work here in training 
and informing the women of the 
home how to meet emergencies as 
well as take care of ftie common 
ills that beset a family so often.

RATIONING 
AT A GLANCE

Mr. and Mrs. Alexander of 
Wellington are visiting their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Chas. 
Bairfield.

Pig
FFA Youths Start 

Projects For 
Spring Shows

Members of the Clarendon F.F. 
A. are rapidly securing their pigs 
for the 1944 Spring shows and are 
starting them on feed at this time. 
Pigs of each of the six leading 
breeds, cheater whites, durocs, 
black and spotted Poland Chinas, 
hampshires and berkshires will be 
fed out and exhibited, according 
to J. R. Gillham, vocational agri­
culture instructor.

A large portion of the boys have 
already selected and secured their 
pigs according to Gillham, and the 
remainder will do so before No­
vember 1st. Every boy in Donley 
County who has the proper set-up 
and has plenty of skim milk to 
feed a pig will have an opportun­
ity to feed out a club barrow if he 
desires. A number of business men 
have agreed to furnish any boy 
who has skim milk to feed a pig, 
a well blooded pig, and the feed 
to feed him, if he is interested in 
carrying on a pig project. Any 
youth desiring to enter this plan 
should contact F.F.A. adviser J. R. 
Gillham at once.

The Donley County, Amarillo, 
Houston, and Fort Worth Stock 
Sl)ows will be held in the spring 
and all club youths feeding bar- 
rows in addition to helping in the 
v, ar effort by producing food, will 
have an opportunity to exhibit 
his barrow.

Bronchos to Play 
Shamrock Today

The Clarendon High School 
Bronchos are at Shamrock this 
afternoon to battle the Shamrock 
Irishmen B team. The gamp was 
scheduled to start at 3:30.

The Broncs went over with the 
intention of scoring another vic­
tory after defeating the Groom 
Tigers 18 to 6 last week. The, lo­
cals, according to Coach Flip 
Breedlove, are in fine shape and 
are handling the pig skin better 
each day of practice.

The probable starting line-up is 
Holland and Williams at ends, 
Cowan and Mann at tackles, Lov­
ell and Bromley at guards and 
Bentley at center. Morgan, Adams, 
Murri and Carlile will be in the 
beckfield.

Due to the fact that the Sham­
rock games have been scheduled 
for playing on Thursday's, we 
would like to state that the Sham­
rock team will return this game 
Thursday night, October 28 at 
College field. This is an old rivalry 
game and even though we get 
licked this week, it is all the more 
reason you should see the game 
next Thursday and we know the 
boys will be doing their very best 
on their own home ground to de­
feat the Irish if at all possible. 
Make your plans now to be there.

BILLY EARL, LYNN
Billy Earl Lynn, of tha Navy, 

left Wednesday alter visiting a 
few days with his grandparents. 
Mr. and Mrs. F. M. Lynn and Mr. 
S. A. Pierce. Billy Earl Is the son 
ol Mr. and Mrs. Earl Lynn of 
Amarillo and is a native of Clar­
endon. having lived here when he 
was a small boy.

He is a veteran of the Battle for 
KUka. He stated that three boats 
were shot out from under him 
during the engagement but he es­
caped mishap each time. He is 
now on furlough before being 
transferred to Norfolk, Vs.

By PEPPY BLOCKER

Remefnber to take your War 
Ration Book No. Ill with you 
when you go to register for Book 
IV this weekend; you must have 
Book III before Book IV can be 
issued to you. This rule is set up 
by the National office and must be 
followed so please do not ask the 
teacher helping you with your ap­
plication to make any exception to 
this rule. Due to a shortage of 
forms, you may have been unable 
to secure an application from your 
grocer; in this case, you may pick 
up your application blank at the 
school where you register and any 
teacher will be glad to assist you 
in filling it in.

All rural residents will register 
at their nearest schools on Friday, 
October 22 from 9:00 a. m. to 
9:00 p. m. Clarendon residents 
may register on Thursday from 
1:00 to 5:00 p. m. at the Cbllege or 
on Friday or Saturday from 9:00 
to 6:00.

Sugar Stamp 14 expires Novem­
ber 1st. Nos. 15 and 16, for can­
ning, both are good through Oc­
tober 31.

• *  •

Ceiling prices for ammunition 
for civilian use were established 
at retail and wholesale levels at 
prices corresponding to those pre­
vailing in March, 1942, the district 
Office of Price Administration, 
said today. They advised that the 
WPB was releasing a quantity 
during this time for use during 
hunting season.

At the wholesale level, five 
zones have boon-established In
which prices are subject to sellere- 
transportation'  terms and dis­
counts in effect during March, 
1942. The retail level sets a def­
inite dollar and cents price in a 
nationwide ceiling which must be 
posted in stores selling ammuni­
tion. They include;

Shotgun shells (25 in a box); 12 
gauge, $1.38; 16 gauge, $1.32; 20 
gauge, $1.32.

Rim Fire Cartridges (50 in a 
box) .22 long rifle, reg. 34c; .22 
short, reg. 21c.

Center Fire Cartridges (20 in a 
box) .25-35 Winchester, $1.41; 
.300 Savage-Remington, $1.85; .SO­
SO Winchester, $1.46; .32 Winches­
ter Special, $1.46; .30 Remington. 
$1.46; .270 Winchester, $2.10.

0D T  Issues 
New Order

Common carriers may not be 
used to make retail or wholesale 
deliveries to circumvent the new 
motor delivery restrictions, which 
went into effect Oct. 11, the Office 
of Defense Transportation an­
nounced today. Although motor 
common carriers are not specific­
ally included in the ODT’s deliv­
ery restriction order, persons# re­
quiring deliveries to be made are 
prohibited from hiring a common 
carrier to make deliveries in ex­
cess of the number permitted by 
the order. For example, the ODT 
said a retail merchant who had al­
ready received his maximum of 
four wholesale deliveries of ice 
cream in a week could not hire a 
package delivery concern to make 
additional motfir deliveries to him 
in the same week. Likewise, the 
merchant could not hire a “dime- 
delivery” carrier to make addi­
tional retail deliveries of ice 
cream to a customer after the 
customer’s one weekly delivery 
had been made. In addition to 
limiting the wholesale and retail 
weekly delivery frequency of 
commodities the ODT’s order also 
imposes a 5 lb. or 60 inch weight 
and size limitation on retail de­
liveries of packages. Shippers are 
similarly forbidden from employ­
ing motor common carriers to 
make delivery of under size or un­
der weight packages. The ODT 
has prepared a series of questions 
and answers on this subject which 
are available at the ODT Informa­
tion Office.

R e g istratio n  Begins 
Th is Th u rsd a y F o r  
R a tio n  B o o k  IV

RUMMAGE Sa l E 
THIS SATURDAY

The Dorcas-Althean class of the 
First Baptist Church will have a 
Rummage Sale Saturday, October 
23rd in the old Patman Bldg., 
south of Pastime Theatre.

Any contribution of wearing ap 
parel or “what have you?” will be 
greatly appreciated.

Mrs. Pete Engle and daughter 
Emily of Abilene returned home 
Tuesday after spending the week 
end with her sister, Mrs. Will 
Patman and other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. John Fowlkes and 
family of the Naylor community 
visited his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
R. W. Fowlkes the week end.

Mrs. Ruth Jacobs and son Guy 
Allen left for Dallas Friday night 
where she has work.

DR. KEITH LOWELL TO TAKE 
POST-GRADUATE COURSE 
IN PHILADELPHIA

Dr. Keith S. Lowell left Thurs­
day, October 21st to attend a post­
graduate course given* by the 
American College of Osteopathic 
Surgeons in Philadelphia, Penn.

Dr. Lowell reports that one of 
the principal speakers will be Dr. 
Louis Kress, the medical director 
of the division of Cancer Control, 
Department of Health, in the stato 
of New York. Dr. Kress is chair­
man of the New York state branch 
of the American Society for Con­
trol of Cancer.

All of the latest advancements 
in surgery will be presented at 
this clinical assembly.

Dr. Lowell plans to return home 
on November 2nd.

His wife, Dr. Laura Lowell will 
take over his practice during his 
absence.

BILLY C. SIMS RECEIVES 
SUSPENDED SENTENCE 
IN DISTRICT COURT
• Billy C. Sims, who was charged 
with burglary, pleaded guilty be­
fore District Judge A. S. Moss 
Monday and received a four year 
suspended sentence. Billy was 
charged with the theft of the 
school trophies at Lelia Lake last 
summer.

Outline of Changes Being Made In The 
Old Age Assistance Program

Bronchos Trounce 
Groom Tigers 
18 to 6

The Bronchos came out of their 
game last Friday night victorious. 
The first victory experienced so 
far this year. The score of 18-6 
against the Groom Tigers is part­
ly explained by the inexperience 
of the Groom team and the light­
ness of the players, also combined 
with the splendid improvement of 
the local*. 
t  W. S. Carlile did, all the scoring 
for the Broncs. He plunged over 
for the first count, caught a beau­
tiful pass and sprinted about 35 
yards for the second and took a 
lateral near midfield and went 
over for the third. The Groom 
tally came in the closing minutes 
of the game and the visitors are 
to be complimented on the way 
they stayed in there and fought 
every second of the playing time 
even though they were on the 
losing end. t

Father of Local 
Woman Dies

Dr. Sylvester Ley man Ingham, 
pioneer Canyon dentist and father 
of Mrs. Millard Word, died at a 
Canyon hospital early Wednesday 
morning. Always ready to take his 
part in the civic and religious ac­
tivities of Canyon, the pioneer 
dentist was a member of the 
Presbyterian church, the Rotary 
Club, the Masonic Lodge and the 
Panhandle District Society of 
Dentistry. He was a generous con­
tributor to charity, and Canyon 
people say the dentist always was 
ready to help someone in n^ed or 
trouble.

Survivors include his wife, a 
son, Dr. George Ingham, a daugh­
ter, Mrs. M. R. Word and three 
grandchildren, Mary Charlotte, 
Robert Ingham and Mildred Word, 
all of Clarendon.

Funeral services will be held at 
4 o'clock this afternoon at the 
First Presbyterian church of Ama­
rillo, with Dr. R. Thomsen offici­
ating. Burial will be in Llano 
Cemetery.

PANHANDLE MEN ARE 
GERMAN PRISONERS

Second Lieut. William B. Bag- 
well, son of Mrs. R. L. Bagwell of 
Claude, and Staff Sgt. Chester J. 
Beasley, husband of Mrs. Ima Lee 
Beasley of Shamrock are listed in 
Wednesday’s war department re­
port as being German prisoners 
of war.

No mention was made as to 
where these men were captured. 
Or as to where they are being held.

On October 20 the Old Age As­
sistance program in Texas will be­
gin operation under a new set of 
rules. A reexamination of the de­
partment’s definition of need has 
been made and policies have been 
changed in an effort to adjust the 
program to the limitations im­
posed by the current appropria­
tion. We expect the net result of 
these changes to be a shifting of 
money from the least needy to the 
most needy persons.

The law states that a person 
must be in need in order to re­
ceive Old Age Assistance. Need is 
not defined except that the law 
states that the amount of assist­
ance given shall provide a reason­
able subsistence compatible with 
decency and health, subject to the 
$30 limitation, and prohibits con­
sideration of:

(1) A resident homestead;
(2) The ability of applicant's 

child or other relative, except hus­
band or wife, to support;

(3) Income and resources which 
are not actually known to exist 
and which are not actually avail­
able to the applicant.

On the other hand, the law re­
quires that consideration must be 
given .to income and other re­
sources actually available to an 
applicant, including contributions 
from relatives where there is rea­
sonable certainty that these con­
tributions will continue. In those 
instances where relatives have 
made the statement that contribu­
tions would not be made in the 
future but such contributions 
have continued, the law requires 
full weight be given to this in­
come in determining the extent of 
an applicant’s unmet needs.

It is necessary for the Depart­
ment of Public Welfare to define 
need in specific terms, itemizing 
the necessities to be provided and 
setting out what resources a per­
son may have and still be consid­
ered in such needy circumstances 
as to require assistance from the 
state.

In October, 182,305 persons re­
ceived Old Age Assistance checks 
in Texas. These persons were cer 
tified by individual investigation 
of their circumstances to need a 
total of $4,258,093. There was only 
$3,776,807.80 available for pay 
ment. Since the Old Age Assist

ance Fund lacked $481,285.20 to 
pay full grants, $2.64 had to be de­
ducted from the certified amount 
of each grant in writing checks.

All persons on the rolls are not 
In the same condition of need. Cir­
cumstances range from those who 
have qualified under the maxi­
mum provisions of the law to the 
opposite extreme of complete 
destitution. A flat cut takes from 
those in extreme need the same 
as from those who could secure 
equivalent support if the program 
were discontinued. While it is

(See OLD AGE, Page Eight)

FREEZING TEMPERATURE 
RECORDED SATURDAY

The first freezing temperature 
of the year was recorded at the 
Airport Saturday, October 16th. 
31.9 on that date was the mini­
mum for the week, and the maxi­
mum was 91.9 on Monday. The 
precipitation was .08 on Tuesday. 
The low temperature recorded 
this morning was 35.9.

Mary Essco Moore 
Buried Here Tues.

Funeral services were held 
Tuesday afternoon at the Church 
of Christ for Mary Essco Moore 
with M. F. Manchester, local min­
ister, officiating. Mrs. Moore, a 
former resident of Donley Coun­
ty, passed away at Modesto, Califg 
October 14th.

She is survived by one daugh­
ter and two sons by a former mar­
riage, Curtis Hankins of Claren­
don, Hurtis W. Hankins of Borger 
and Mrs. Wyneth Bryan of Con­
roe, Texas. Also three daughters 
and one son by the present mar­
riage. They are Mrs. Lola Hunsley, 
Mrs. Mildred Hunsley, Miss Pau­
line Moore and Eugene Moore, all 
of Memphis. Her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. M. H. Anderson of Claren­
don; also two brothers and eight 
sisters, nine grandchildren.

Pallbearers were Jake Lagronc, 
Roy Mabery, Olin Bain, Gilbert 
Lane, Allen Hardin and Terrell 
Trussed.

Burial was in Citizens cemetery 
with Buntin Funeral Home In 
charge of arrangements.

Consumers were advised today by 
Chairman Cap Morris of the Don­
ley County War Price and Ration­
ing Board to take their War Ra­
tion Book III with them when 
they go October 21 to 23 to regis­
ter for the new War Ration 
Book IV.

“No new ration books are to be 
issued consumers who don’t pro­
duce the No. 3 book,” Chairman 
Morris declared. “Housewives, or 
any other member of the family, 
may sign up for the entire family 
group at this registration as they 
did at registrations for Nos. 1 and 
2 books.”

The No. 3 book was issued last 
summer by mall, but the new one 
will be issued at school houses by 
teachers and other volunteer 
workers “who have proved their 
ability to do the job quickly and 
efficiently,” the chairman said.

“I know the public appreciates 
the willingness of teachers and 
other volunteers to undertake the 
tremendous responsibility involv­
ed in the distribution of ration 
books, and speaking on behalf of 
the board, I know we do,” Chair­
man Morris added.

Teachers and other workers, re­
ceiving instructions on the issu­
ance, have been advised that con­
sumers are to apply for the books 
at their nearest school house. The 
book will be distributed to all 
persons except members of the 
armed forces who are subsisted or 
who are members of officers' 
messes, persons confined to insti­
tutions and persons who have re­
sided less than 60 days in the 
United States. The registration 
will be held Oct. 21, 22 and 23 in 
Texas, Arkansas, Missouri and 
Kansas and Oct. 25, 26 and 27 in 
Oklahoma and Louisiana.

Registration for all rural resi­
dents will be at the nearest school 
building on Friday, October 22, 
from 9:00 a. m. to 9:00 p. m. In 
Clarendon, applications will be 
taken on Thursday, October 21 
from 1:00 p. m. to 5:00 p. m. and 
on Friday, October 22 and Satur­
day, October 23, from 9:00 a. m. to 
6:00 p. m. It was previously plan­
ned that the local force would 
work until 9:00 p. m., but a check­
up revealed that this would be 
unnecessary and would work a 
hardship on the teachers who are 
handling the registration.

War Ration Book IV, which will 
last approximately two years, 
combines point and unit stamps. 
It has eight pages containing a 
total of 384 stamps, printed on 
safety paper in blue, red, green 
and black inks. The green stamps 
probably will be used as supple­
mentary stamps. There are 96 unit 
stamps printed in black ink. The 
word “spare” appears on 72 of 
these stamps, which can be used 
in the case additional ration cur­
rency is needed for any of the 
programs. Twelve of the stamps 
have the word “sugar” printed on 
them and an equal number is 
designated for coffee, which no 
longer is rationed. Now that coffee 
rationing has been suspended and 
ration stamps are not required to 
buy it, the3e stamps will also be 
used as “spares.”

EXTRA COPIES OF 
VICTORY EDITION 
AVAILABLE

For those of you wlio did not 
get one of the Victory books, we 
wish to inform that we have sev­
eral copies of the Leader Supple­
ment copy left which will be sold 
to the first callers. These Supple­
ment copies are just like thedbooks 
except for the back and grade of 
paper used.

Those who have Victory books 
reserved please call for them as 
soon as possible or let us know 
why you are delayed.

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Land are 
visiting their son and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Marvin Land at Tucum- 
cari, N. Mex.
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Manpower
Savings

Army Ordnance productoin is 
steadily increasing while man­
power requirements are constant­
ly declining.

Garand rifle production is soar­
ing, for example, but in its pro­
duction two Army Ordnance em­
ployees can now do in a days 
work which formerly required 
four employees.

This typical achievement high- 
lightg a recent manpower survey 
of Ordnance factories, arsenals 
and depots throughout the coun­
try, a copy of which was received 
to-day by Captain R. M. Smith,

commanding Pantex Ordnance 
Plant, near Amarillo, Texas.

‘'Increased production with less 
manpower," Captain Smith said, 
“is attributed to two factors: con­
stantly improving industrial fa­
cilities and manufacturing tech­
nique, combined with constantly 
increasing skill on the part of 
Ordnance employees.”

During the past year, according 
to Captain Smith, civilian person­
nel in Ordcnce Department head­
quarters in Washington declined 
34 percent; in the 13 decentralized 
Ordnance procurement districts 
was 28 percent; in Ordnance ar­
senals and proving grounds the 
decline was 16 percent; in Field 
Service establishments the de­
cline was 20 percent; and in gov-

Overweight Oil makes 
Old Cars Older-Fast

Note how Light a grade of oil can make good, 
with your engine Winter OIL-PLATED

You can change to an otl-flatkd engine by changing to 
any grade of Conoco N fA motor oil—from lightest to 
heaviest—and you can change to any grade of Conoco Nf A 
at the same popular price. But the lightest possible grade 
of oil that’s fit for tho Winter change your car needs now 
will help to save your battery—your gasoline—your engine. 
Tho more the oil is overweight the greater the wear, and 
when that makes you try still heavier oil you get still more 
wear—still more oil and gasoline consumption—worse and 
worse and worse. Short-circuit this ruinous process by 
having your engine oil-plated .

O il-pi.attnc, is distinct from the familiar liquid type of 
high-strength oil film also provided by Conoco N'A oil. 
Both oil film and oil-plating are paired against wear every 
mile. Every tune your engine rests, however, any liquid 
film drains down to the crankcase. But oil-plating  doesn’t 
all drain down. It tends to stay wherever attached by 
Conoco N*A oil's "magnet-like” action—achieved syn­
thetically. Often now you don’t use your car for days. Yet 
when you start, tho oil-plated  surfaces are atill ready- 
lubricated . .  ."faster than instantly.” That’s how tho

former fierce wear of cold start­
ing is reduced by o il-platino  
you* engine. All other wear, 
too, meets its match in your 
o il-plated engine. Change at 
Your M ileage M erchant’s 
Conoco station—today. He 
knows the lightest grade of N fh 
for you. Continental Oil Co.

Dread Engine Acid is 
Fought by OIL-PLATING
Normal combustion always 
leaves acids inside of your 
engine when it stops.

Formerly it seldom stood 
Idle long. Boon mileage and 
speed heated your engine 
enough to oust adds.

But nowadays rationing  
may force long rests, while 
corrosive acids gnaw. To 
combat corrosion, metals 
sre plated. You combat acid 
corroeion with your engine 
OIL-PLATED.

M O T O R  O I L

RATION TOKENS 
IN FEBRUARY

Ration tokens are expected to 
be ready for use by February. 
They will be red and blue and 
each will have a value of one 
point. They will be used by con­
sumers as change for processed 
foods and meat-fats ration stamps. 
The blue tokens will be usejl for 
buying foods rationed under the 
meat-fats program. The ration 
coins, made; of layers of vulcan­
ized riber, will be slightly larger 
than a nickel and smaller than a 
quarter.

Ray Couch had a very serious 
operation at the Methodist Hos­
pital at Ft. Worth Wednesday of 
last week. He is in a very serious
condition.

f VrttoriW i  f t

GRAY HAIR?
Im partial in v e a tlfa u n  
h av e  fo u n d  v i ta m in  
Calcium  Pan to thenata  
oI tome value in chang- 
in* gray hair, where a  
deficiency o t this vita­
min may have earned 
gray or graying hair.

Foe example, one teat conducted by Good 
luuaekeeping magaaine on a numhet.pl people, 

allowed 88% ot thoae teated (all agea were in-■ IkOWCU OO 70 Ul UW" '-----------------.
eluded) had positive evidence or a  re turn  ot 
some hair color.

Now thouaanda uae CRAYVITA. which con­
tains 10 m in t of Calcium Pantothenate (the 
•sm e am ount! uaed in above teats) PLUS 450 
U S P .  units of Dt, the vitamin neccaeary to 
healthy nerves Try CRAYVITA. See w hat a 
difference i t  may make in the way you look. 
30 day supply. 8150. 100 day supply. 48-00.

Thousands Use GRAYV1TA

DOUGLAS & GOLDSTON

HOLY MATRIMONY— Starring Monty Wooley and Gracie 
Fields, which comes to The Pastime Theatre, Saturday Night 
Prevue, Sunday and Monday, October 23, 24, 25th.

ernment-owned contractor - oper­
ated Ordnance plants a 37 percent 
decline was register'd.

Last year 4.466 workers were 
required to produce one million 
rounds of small arms ammunition 
a day. Statistics from Ordnance 
plants indicate that only 1,832 
workers are necessary to-day to 
produce the same amount.

Farmers Produce 
Record Crops In 
Face of Hardship

The farmers of the United 
States this year cultivated more 
land and are producing more live­
stock products than ever before, 
according to the Bureau of Agri­
cultural Economics.

In the spring of 1943, farmers 
planted the largest crop in history 
—in spite of bad weather, a de­
creasing supply of farm labor, and 
little hope of getting new farm 
machinery.

This year’s unprecedented pro­
duction has been achieved with 
less hired farm labor than farm­
ers used in 1942, according to the 
Bureau. It has been made possible 
by the ingenuity of the individual 
farmers and their families and 
through the cooperation of farm­
ers and representatives of county 
agricultural agencies.

Farbiers and their families have 
worked longer hours. Farmers 
have exchanged farm work with 
their neighbors, they have made 
better use of available farm ma­
chinery, and they have found 
farm workers with the assistance 
of the Extension Service and 
through importation of workers 
who were placed locally by the 
county agricultural agents and his 
associates.

In a survey of 50 typical coun­
ties throughout the United States, 
the bureau found the following 
factors favorable to record agri­
cultural production;

1. Relatively good prices for 
farm products allow the farmer to

make money and impress upon 
him the importance of his job.

2. Deferment of farm workers 
by Selective Service is evidence 
to the farmer that the government 
appreciates his contribution.

3. The farmer is pleased with 
the increase in local responsibility 
for administration of the farm 
program.

4. The “panic stage” of farm 
labor shortages is over for the 
present at least.

5. The farmer likes to produce 
without the restrictions of de­
pression years.

The assignment of specific crop 
and livestock quotas to each coun­
ty has been an important factor in 
this year’s farming activities, 
farmers indicate. Many of them 
volunteered for enlarged quotas, 
and most of the others readily ac­
cepted quotas assigned them by a 
county committee.

Most farmers, the survey show­
ed, take pride in growing their 
part of the county's “new potato 
quota” or whatever crop it may 
be. They like to learn in advance 
what is expected of them and 
why. They like to know what 
their shares of the familiar and 
unfamiliar crops are and plan ac­
cordingly.

The farmers showed by their 
responses that they like to pro­
duce. They like to see crops grow 
and mature. They get more out of 
a field of corn or wheat, cabbages 
or carrots, than the money the 
crop sells for. They like to see 
crops respond to rain and sun and 
to see them withstand a drought 
or a wet spell because of their 
own skill in planting and culti­
vating or in choosing satisfactory 
varieties. And farmers are happy 
now. they said, because the gov­
ernment is encouraging them to 
produce all the food and fiber 
they can. '

Mr. and Mrs. D.E I gathers and 
daughter, Mrs. J. R. Williams, 
spent the week end visiting their 
son Johnny Leathers at Naval 
Base Hospital. Grand Prairie; also 
visited relatives at Ft. Worth.

For Complete Insurance 

Coverage On All

FARM & RANCH 
P R O P E R T Y
IMPLEMENTS

MACHINERY
GRAIN, CAKE

COTTON SEED
BARNS, DWELLING or HOUSEHOLD FURNITURE

KELLY CHAMBERLAIN
I N S U R A N C E  

PROMPT ADJUSTMENTS
Clarendon Phone day 79 or Night 65

The Prep
SHAVE

DeLuxe

Next <

CLEAN, COOL SHAVES
YES, we take pride in pleasing 
you. Once you try our Prep Shave 
and feel the difference, you will 
always come beck for the next 
•have. We will appreciate e visit 
from you. Let us prove itl

McGOWAN’S 
Barber Shopto  P in t  National Bank

Feed Grinding and Mixing 

That Saves You Money
Now that feeds of all kinds are much higher, it will 
pay you to have us grind and mix your feeds the 
way you want them so you can get the greatest 
benefit for your money.

We have feeds of all kinds, including Bran, Shorts. 
Wheat chops. Wheat. Kaffir, Maise. Kaffir chops. Head 

chops and a complete line of fresh Chic-O-Llno Poultry 

feeds—there is none better. We invite you to visit us 
today.

Simpson’s Mill & Feed Store
«

PHONE 14 9

What YOU Want is the 

Right to HAVE 

and to HOLD!

You’ve always wanted it. We all have. 'First it 

was marbles, then a bike, then a car, then a 

house. Now it’s more than that. Now we all want 

to have and to hold is our way of life, our form of 

government, our country.

Fortunately, we HAVE that right. All we need to

do is protect and preserve it. You can do your

share by investing every penny you can in War

Stamps and Bonds.
> •

«

Donley c o u n t v
STA TE BANK *

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

PAY PROMPTLY •  KEEP YOUR CREDIT GOOD

P A S T IM E

T H E A T R E
Continuous Show Each Saturday 

Beginning at 2:00 p. m.
Two Shows Sunday 

Beginning at 2 and 4 p. m. 
Other Days Three Shows Daily 
Baginning at 5:30—7:30—9:30 

Admission Evary Day 
Except Tuesday ll-30c (Tax Inc.) 

Bargain Day Tuaaday ll-15c

LAST TIMES 
FRIDAY, OCTOBER 22nd

Betty Grablo and 
Geo. Montgomery

“CONEY ISLANDi f

SATURDAY ONLY 
OCTOBER 23rd
Ann Miller and 
John Hubbard 

—in—

What’s Buzzin Cousin
Cartoon and Our Gang Comedy

SATURDAY PREVUE * 
SUNDAY & MONDAY 

OCTOBER 23-25th

WOOLLEY
6 (m l c ic

FIELDS

LAIRD CRECAR
lin t O'Connor 
Also Mowkrty 
Melville Cooper 

Franklin Psnfkom
Directed by JOHN STAHL  

_  Produced and Written lor tho 
Screen by NUNNALLY JOHNSON 
from  the Novel by Arnold Bennett

Passing Parade and Traveltalk

TUESDAY ONLY 
OCTOBER 26th

LAUREL and HARDY
—In—

“JITTERBUGS”
Cartoon and Sports Reel

WEDNESDAY - THURSDAY 
A FRIDAY, OCTOBER 27-29th

Franchot Tone
and

Anne Baxter

“FIVE GRAVES 

TO CAIRO’
Fox News and Pete Smith

— C O M I N G — 
October 30-31at. Nov. 1st. 

Lena Horn and all Color Coat 
In "STORMY WEATHER”

COZY THEATRE
SATURDAY, OCTOBER 23rd 

{CHARLES STARRETT

Hail To The Rangeri
Chapter 9 of 

“THE SECRET CODE”
A dm. U-20c

■ I ; 1 I '
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♦  ♦
♦  THE t e m p l e  o f  t r u t h  ♦
♦  •  ♦
* By tha Apoetle •
•  ♦ 
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦
DETECTION.

It’s an easy matter .to locate the 
folks in a hick town who are pull­
ing down the best money. You 
will always see more dogs fighting

over the garbage container in the 
alley behind the homes of the best 
spenders.

♦  ♦  ♦
LOOKING BACKWARD.

Look over the old family port­
raits. You may find an incentive 
for going on a rigid diet.

♦  ♦  ♦  
SCIENTIFIC.

Replying to a query from a local 
college student: A horsepower is

an activity of 746 watts; a watt is 
the rate of doing work- to the 
amount of 1 joule a second; a joule 
is 10 million ergs; an erg is a force 
of one dyne tugging along for a 
distance of 1 centimeter second; a 
dyne is equal to the weight of one 
Panhandle gray mosquito 15 sec­
onds after death in a room of a 
temperature of 72 degrees and a 
humidity of 3.7289. There is noth­
ing like accuracy, young lady.

n ii . .  . ...

MEASURE.
Some times you meet up'with a 

fellow whose head is as empty as 
a nickel sack of chocolate candy. 

♦  ♦  ♦ 
DIPLOMACY.

A laugh covers up a multitude 
of embarassing pauses, providing 
you know which pause to cover 
up. On the other hand, the abrupt 
ending of a giggle is about the 
most embrassing thing to close

' f *

m i * to o n  BUYS !
L Y E
American high test—3 Cans 25c
FRUIT COCKTAIL
No. 1 tall can ....................................................... 17c
TOMATO PUREE
4Y« ox. Can .............................................................. . 5c
CAKE FLOUR
Swansdown—23,<t lbs............................................. ......... 29c

SOAP
Crystal White—6 Bars 25c
WHITE KING
Large Size ............................................................. 29c
CATSUP
Kuners—14 ox. Bottle 19c

LARD

CHOICE and FANCY CUTS 
Q U A L I T Y  M E A T S

_____________ GRAIN FED BABY BEEF_____________

COFFEE—Bright & Early

I Pound . . . .  29c
FLOUR—American Beauty 

24 Pounds...........................$ £ 2 9
iiimuiuimmiiiimiiiiiiiiNiitHinniimiM

SNO WHITE 
Pinkneya 
4 lb. Carton .59

HONEY—Packed by Burleson 

5 lb. P a il................................ $ £ 1 9

TOMATO JUICE-House of George 

No. 2 C an ...............  l i e

SPUDS Good Whites 

10 Pounds . . . .39
PEACHES—Sliced or Halves 

No. 2Vi C a n .....................
LIGHT SYRUP PACKED
MH!ltHllttll(nilinililHM?f9ltlllllII!ttlMlliiiiiiiiiiitiHj!ninnnTITT!7T!!!

PINEAPPLE—Sliced Hawaii

No. 2 C a n ........................ 21C
niiinmiiHtiiinmiiiiiiiiminmtmimiiinnnnum

DRY GOODS DEPARTMENT
All color Gabardine. - - T 0 C  UP
T . . . 1  — ̂ ^ m  J  m  A tw  a l« « M a M A n 4  D 1 A Y / \ f t / l c

3 8 c
Just received new shipment Piece Goods.

Feather Flannel
NEW SHADES

Mistery Spun
NEW FALL SHADES 5 9 c
Printed Spun 6 9 c
Sand Crepe 8 9 c  up

Asitate Rayon
45 inch 9 8 c  yd
Navy Spun 8 9 c
Boat Sail Drill 39c
Crash Towel ing. . . . . .  £ Q c  yd
ALL LINEN ^

Seersucker 6 9 c  yJ
Men's Navy Twill

Hat Cap
All Sites

$£49

See our Warm

GLOVES
and Mittens

3 9 c  "p

COMFORTS
Part Wool 

and all Wool

S /^ 5 0  up

FARMERS EXCHANGF
*  GRO CERIES &  M A RK ET J - 1
Phone 63-J W E D E L I V E R Phone 63-J

down. It’s a great deal like the 
doorknob coming off in your hand 
in the dark room, etc.

♦  ♦  ♦  
ESTIMATION.

In making an estimate of a man, 
each individual naturally has his 
own standards. That takes us 
back to the proposition that when 
you judge one, you really judge 
three. The individual: The guy 
you think you are; the guy you 
appear to be; and the inner you.

♦ ♦ ♦ 
PIONEERISH.

Enterprise springs from confi­
dence. That takes us b'ack to years 
ago when the drouth had “raunch- 
ed” on the Panhandle for months. 
Dear old aunt Twila continued to 
talk about the weather. “Looks 
like rain today," she'd say.

♦ ♦ ♦
RADIO STUFF.

With the beginning of the radio 
orgies, often termed the winter 
programs, we huve to endure the 
alleged singing of many who oc­
cupy their places through pull. 
Few of them have a cultivated 
voice. Most of them were merely 
summer fallowed. If it were not 
for Kate Smith, danged if I 
wouldn’t give my radio away to 
some enemy of the nation. Let 
him suffer for a while.

♦ ♦ ♦
THE PESSIMIST.

A pessimist always wears both 
belt and suspenders. Last summer 
out at Albuquerque, an optimist’s 
suspenders broke and when his 
pants came down, he could not 
hold up pants and invade enemy 
territory at the same time. Con­
sequently, the old boy got whip­
ped. He is likely a pessimist long 
before now.

♦ ♦ ♦
LAND OF DYEING.

Some of the war news is color­
ful. For instance Red advances in­
to White Russia is making Hitler 
blue.

♦ ♦  ♦
ANOTHER BLONDE.

With new contraptions being 
put on the market, we have natur­
al blondes, peroxide blondes, 
platinum blondes, and now comes 
the suicide blondes—the kind that 
dye by their own hands.

-» ♦  ♦ 
BRILLIANCY.

The first few times that a kitten 
gets its tail caught in the door, do 
yop suppose it rushes to its mam­
ma and tells her that it would 
have been much better if all cats 
had been frogs. The young are so 
intelligent these days!!!

One Job Well Done Begets Another
T H E R E ’S no satisfaction  in all the  world like th e  feeling o f  

having done a jo b  well — of being able to  tee th e  resu lts o f 
your work. T his is one th ing  th a t  all producers o f  useful th ings have
in common.

And those of us whose jo b  is p roduction—w hether o f goods on 
farm s and  in factories, or of services in stores and  banks and u tilitie s  
—can best see th e  resu lts o f ou r work in th e  high s tan d ard  of liv ing  
w hich we have helped to  c rea te  in Am erica. F o r th is  s ta n d a rd  is 
b u ilt on our ab ility  to  produce m ore per person th a n  any  o th e r  
n a tio n  on earth . And th e  people o f  every  co u n try , who are  looking 
hopefully to  us for food and  w eapons, can count on Am erica because 
i t  has th is great p roductive  m ight.

A fter th e  war is over? M an y  people are ta lk in g  ab o u t a richer life 
for all of us then . And th e y ’re r ig h tl For th a t  richer life will be 
b rough t abou t, no t by  prom ises, b u t by  hard  work on th e  p a r t o f  
A m erica's producers. And th e y —those who grow and  m ake and  do  
th in g s—can do th is post-w ar jo b  b e tte r  if th ey  work together and 
u n d erstand  each other. General Electric Co., Schenectady, N. Y.

Hear the General Electric radio programi: "The G-E All-girl Orcbtitra" 
Sunday JO p m. EtVT, SBC— "Tht World Today" ntwlf  

terry weekday 6:4} p.m. ElYT, CBS.

BUY WAR BONDS

GENERAL H  ELECTRIC

Keep up ihe »te*dy flow “ 
of M ILK  t«  m arket! It -*•  
m e n u  PO W E R  on  th e  ^  
war Iron! and on the home 
front, toql Feed your baby calves Security Calf 
Food and spare your milk T he difference in cost 
will am aie you Dairymen have used Security for 
40 years A 2S lb pail takes care of four calves foe 
atx weeks Come in for a pail I

Simpson’s Mill b Feed Store
Clarendon, Texas

p a n M a K :
i c i* IU L

Electric Fencer
HERE'S YOUR EXTRA  

HIRED HAND
Is c n o H d  l i v e *  
ito ck  production 
f o r  W a r  d o -  
m and i and hiph- 
ar farm

incoma I f — YOU 
K E E P  C O S T S  
D O W N . N o w  
fo r m  proproms 
demand chanp-

Let ns asplnin  
how yon can nop 
your o ld  w lrp .  
s o y #  T I M E .  
L A B O R  a n d  
MONEY —  end 

MAKE YOUR EASM EARN M ORI with of- 
fklont, law-cost f  ARM AK Electric Fonclnp.
.A ,  5 -Y E A R  S E R V IC E  G U A R A N T E E  _A _  
W  W O R L D 'S  L A R G E S T  S E L L E R  W  

IM M E D IA T E  D E L IV E R Y

Thompson Bros. 

Company
Hardware ft Farm Equipment 

CLARENDON I-1 R EDLIT

J GOLDSTON *
♦ Beatrice Smith ♦
+ + + * + + ♦ + + + + + + ♦ + ♦

The fourth quarterly conference 
was held at the school house Sun­
day. A number from Clarendon, 
Ashtola and Lelia Lake attended. 
Rev. Palmer held church services 
after Sunday school.

Shirley Smith and Imogene 
Wilson spent Sunday with Juanita 
Mooring.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerrel Patterson 
and daughter moved to McLean 
last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Tucker and 
sons moved to Midway last week.

Shirley Smith and Imogene Wil­
son spent Saturday and Sunday 
night with Mr. and Mrs. Buck 
Parker and family.

Mrs. Junior Brame spent Sun­
day with her sister-in-law and 
family, Mrs. Sam Dale.

Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Gee of Amn 
rillo spent Sunday with her par­
ents. Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Haynes

Mr. and Mrs. G. R. Grant of 
Clarendon and Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Hudson of Logan, N. M. attended 
the conference here Sunday.

Goldston school has resumed 
their studies after being out a 
period of four weeks fur cotton 
picking.

Mrs. Johnnie Line spent the 
week end with her daughter Sher­
ry and parents, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Stewart.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Roberson and 
family spent Sunday with his 
mother and sister, Mrs. M. F. Rob­
erson and Minnie.

Mr. and Mrs. King and family 
of Hedley spent Sunday with their 
daughter and family Mr. and Mrs. 
Lester Shields.

John Rowe spent Saturday 
night and Sunday with John 
Smith.

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Shields are 
are proud parents of a baby boy 
arriving on Monday of this week. 
His name is Danna Lester. He 
weighed 8 pounds and 6V& ounces.

NEW ARRIVAL
Corp. and Mrs. Robert W. War­

ren announce the arrival of a son. 
October 14th at Vernon, Texas. 
The name is Bradford G. Warren, 
and Me weighed 7V« lbs. His 
grandparents here are Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Warren.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Dishman left 
Tuesday morning for Denison. 
Texas where they will attend the 
funeral of Mr. Dishman’s brother, 
John E. Dishman who died Sun­
day night.

M i n i n g
1 s s s s x s

LARGE SIZE

4 9 *
NEW FAMILY SIZE *47*
REGULAR SIZEO -*

Douglas & Goldston Drug Co.

THE WAR IS JUST 

COMMENCING IN FACT!

THE GOOD GOVERNMENT OF OURS NEEDS 

EVERY DOLLAR YOU CAN SPARE.

BEST INVESTMENTS 

IN THE WORLD

•

CALL ON US IF YOU

NEED HELP

First National Bank
Mambar Fedaral Daposit Insurance Corporation
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1926 BOOK CLUB
The 1926 Book Club met Tues­

day afternoon in the reception 
room of the Methodist Church in 
one of their best programs of the 
year.

Mrs. Howard Lynch of Ama­
rillo, who has the reputation of 
being one of the Panhandle’s best 
book reviewers, gave a most in­
teresting version of "The Valley 
of Decision” by Marcia Daven­
port.

“The Valley of Decision” is an 
engrossing novel of love and de­
votion, of loyalty and self sacrifice 
which spans nearly seventy years 
of American life and reaches out 
to acknowledge America's inevit­
able ties with other freedom lov­
ing nations.

Mrs. Lynch's constructional crit­
icism, her own version and her 
clever way of placing emphasis 
upon high points of interest en­
thralled her listeners.

The music for the evening was 
furnished by Beverly Stricklin.

The room was beautifully dec­
orated with large baskets ol dah­
lias and snapdragons.

Refreshments were served to 
about seventy five guests, by the 
hostesses, Mrs. Bairfield, Mrs. 
Morris, Mrs. Lowry, Mrs. Gillham 
and Miss Polk.

1930 NEEDLE CLUB
Mrs. Lee Bell entertained this 

Club at her home Tuesday after­
noon. The usual needle work and 
visiting was enjoyed.

In the late afternoon a delicious 
salad course refreshment was ser­
ved to Mmes. Ona Tatum, Ralph 
Decker, Fred Russell, Vada Car­
penter, Ernest Hunt, Guy Wright, 
and hostess, Mrs. Bell.

KILL KARE 
KNEEDLE KLUB

In the borne of Mrs. S. W. Lowe, 
members of the Kill Kare Kneedle 
Klub gathered Thursday after­
noon,

Beautiful dahlias and marigolds 
were seen In abundance through­
out the rooms.

During the meeting, Mrs. T. O. 
Kirby's resignation was accepted 
with regret.

After a pleasant hour, a delic­
ious refreshment plate was served.

Those to enjoy the occasion 
were guests, Mrs. Aiken of Lipan, 
Texas and Mrs. W. T. Lowe; club 
members, Mesdames H. C. Brum- 
ley, R. R. Dawkins, Eva Draffin, 
R. A. Hay, W. A. Massie, H. Mul- 
key, E. H. Noland, Lon Rundcll, 
W. T. Sims. Frank White and the 
hostess, Mrs. Lowe.

1922 BRIDGE CLUB
The 1922 Bridge Club met Tues­

day afternoon for the first time 
this year in the home of Mrs. J. T. 
Sims. Games of bridge were play­
ed at two tables. Mrs. Sims gave 
Victory Stamps for prizes. Mrs. 
Letts won high, Mrs. Gentry, con­
solation.

A lovely salad plate refresh­
ment was served to Mesdames T. 
H. Ellis, Odos Caraway, R. A. 
Chamberlain, C. T. McMurtry, 
Sella Gentry, A. R. Letts, J. L. 
McMurtry, Eva Rhode. Mrs. Car- 
roll Knorpp and her mother, Mrs. 
Church of Long Beach, Calif, were 
tea guests.

GARDEN CLUB
The Garden Club will observe 

guest day Monday, Oct. 25th at 
4 p. m. in the home of Mrs. J. L. 
McMurtry.

Lrinyj you t k t  itn ia tio n a t
w

- JJefene d u r tis

COLD WAVE
A  delightful!/ comfortable creation—cool, refreshing, 
gentle liquids flow with loving care through your hair 
And lol you have silky-soft, lustrous waves . . .  glow­
ing with vitality and naturalness!

d u r tL r 'd o fd
Victoria... $20.00 Impress. . .  $1 S.00 Dechess.. .$10.00

Irene's Beauty Shop
Phone 234-J for Appointment

CLARENDON 
H. D. CLUB

Mrs. A. H. Baker, assisted by 
Mrs. Henry Williams and Miss 
Etta Harned entertained the mem­
bers and guests of this club at the 
home of Mrs. Baker Friday after­
noon. Lovely garden flowers were 
used to decorate the guest rooms.

The Club was opened by Mrs. 
Lea who read the Club Creed. All 
'round discussion on cooking and 
canning was had where a substi­
tute for sugar was used. The Club 
closed with prayer by Mrs. Van 
Eaton and will meet Nov. 19th in 
alt-day meeting at the home of 
Mrs. C. L. Benson. Mrs. Grover 
Heath and Mrs. Ed Speed will as­
sist. Each lady will bring a cover­
ed dish. Roll call will be: "What 
I am most thankful for.”

A lovely refreshment plate was 
served to guests, Mrs. John 
Rhodes, Mrs. W. M. McBrayer, 
and Mrs. W. O. Butler; and to 
club members, Mesdames G. A. 
Anderson. Lena Antrobus, Earl 
Lea, C. D. McDowell, W. D. Van 
Eaton, W. A. Davis, O. C. Watson, 
A. L. Chase, J. C. Estlack, Grover 
Heath and* hostesses, Mrs. Baker, 
Mrs. Williams and Miss Etta 
Harned.

BIRTHDAY DINNER
A birthday dinner honoring 

Mrs. D. T. Smallwood of Brice 
was served in the home of her 
daughter, Mrs. J. G. McAnear 
Sunday, Oct. 17.

Dinner was served buffet style. 
A large cake with 53 candles was 
center piece of the dining table. 
A friend, Mrs. Della Ayers, and 
who was the oldest one present, 
and a granddaughter, Iva Jean 
McAnear, helped Mrs. Smallwood 
blow the candles out.

Twenty six were present in­
cluding Mr. and Mrs. Jake La- 
grone and family of Ashtola, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Ewing of Borger, 
Iva and Eirtle Davis of Comanche, 
Mrs. Weldon Gergary and son, 
Mrs. Bessie Lane, Larry and Mary 
Katherine, Mr. Gilbert Lane and 
Mrs. Della Ayers, all of Claren­
don; Miss Joveta Roberts of Ash­
tola, Mr. and Mrs. D. T. Small­
wood and hosts, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
G. McAnear and Iva Jean.

BarMa of Public Relation*. U. 8. War Department
INDIAN MAIDS JOIN WACS—In proportion to tbo population 

members of North American Indian tribes have an outstanding record 
in volunteering for service in the armed forces. Indian women as 
well as the men are in uniform and engaged in patriotic work. Corporal 
Lillian Llncheze, center, WAC recruiter at Gallup, New Mexico, greets 
two Navajos from the tribe of which she is a member. Her fellow 
tribeswomen in colorful Navajo raiment are (left) Ruth Anne Williams 
and (right) Beatrice Bitaelly. Corporal Llchenxe has done much in 
the enlistment of Indians and la a popular member of the Gallup 
WAC recruiting office.

WORKERS CONFERENCE
Those attending the Workers 

Conference of the Panhandle Bap­
tist Association which met at Tur­
key Tuesday evening were Rev. 
E. L. Moody, Rev. and Mrs. J. R. 
Naylor, W. D. Kidd, Mrs. A. W. 
Simpson and Mrs. Lola Barns. 

_________________  #
Mrs. C. G. Stricklin and daugh­

ter Beverly Gray, left for Dallas 
Wednesday night.

VISIT PARENTS HERE
Mrs. Dale Nix and small son 

Billy Dale of Riverside, Calif., 
and Mrs. C. R. Bingham and two 
children, Lu Olin and Beverly of 
Bartlesville, Okla. are. visiting 
their parents, Rev. and Mrs. J. O. 
Quattlebaum. Mrs. Nix and son 
will go to Canadian Saturday to 
visit Mr. Nix's aunt, Mrs. Jeff 
Todd a few days before leaving 
for her home in Calif.

Ration Reminder
SUGAR — Stamp 14 became 

valid August 16, expires Nov. 1st. 
No. 15 and 16, for canning, good 
for five pounds each through Oc­
tober 31.

SHOES—Stamp No. 18 good for 
1 pair. Validity has been extended 
indefinitely.

MEATS, Fats—Brown stamps 
C, D, E and F good through Oc­
tober 30.

Processed Foods— Blue stamps 
U, V and W expire October 20. 
Blue stamps X, Y and Z are good 
through November 20.
STOVES—Consumer purchases of 
rationed stoves must be made 
with a certificate obtained at local 
war price and rationing boards.

GASOLINE— A-8 coupons be­
came valid September 22nd.

TIRE INSPECTION—“A” book 
holders must have second official 
inspection by September 30; “B” 
book holders, third inspection by 
October 31; and “C” book holders, 
third inspection by August 31; “T” 
book holders, second inspection 
within 6 months of last date of in­
spection or every 5,000 miles, 
whichever comes first.

__Thursday, Octobsr 2L 1945

ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH 
J. J. Grubbs. Pastor

Sunday school—10 a. m. 
Preaching—11 a. m. and 8:45 p.m. 
Prayer Meeting, Wed.—7:30 p. m.

. EPISCOPAL CHURCH OF 
6T. JOHN BAPTIST 

Rev. Frank H. Hutchins. M. Aw 
Clergyman

Mr. Walt*? B. Knorpp.
Lay Raider

Sunday Oct<jber 24th 
Eighteenth Sunday after Trinity 

11 a. m.—Morning Prayer and 
Sermon—Mr. Knorpp.

ATTENDS REUNION
J. H. Hum visited his brother 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hum and
other relatives at Henrietta the 
latter part of last week. He also 
enjoyed the Old Settlers Reunion 
which was being held at that time. 
He returned home Saturday after­
noon with Rev. and Mrs. E. L. 
Moody who had gong down to 
take in the affair at their previous 
home town.

|  Clarendon Clinic J
J Hospital Notes J
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦
Births:

Mrs. E. L. Lewis, Lelia Lake, a 
boy; Mrs. E. A. Tipton, a boy; Mrs. 
Lester Shields, a boy; Mrs. C. C. 
LaGrone, Ashtola, twins (boy and 
girl); Mrs. Lois Tuck, Hedley, a 
boy.
Surgical:

Mrs. Jno. Tolbert, Mrs. Cicero 
Turpen, Miss Bonnie Martin, Mrs. 
Leon Rhodes and Ruth Rhodes. 

Fred Riley, accident victim.

Mrs. Ina Naylor of Carlsbad, 
New Mexico is visiting relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Russ Griswald of 
Canyon spent the week end uiith 
her mother, Mrs. W. D. Martin.

Mr. dnd Mrs. Ed Dishman and 
Mrs. Kendall attended the Golden 
wedding celebration of Mr. and 
Mrs. T. R. Moreman at Hedley 
Sunday.

Johnnie Bates

FIRST CLASS SHINE
AND SHOE DYE JOBS 

' •
at Whitlock's Barba? Shop

DORCAS ALTHEAN 
S. S. CLASS

The Dorcas - Althean Sunday 
school class of the Baptist Church 
met In the home of Mrs. G. G. 
Ayres, Thursday, Oct. 14th with 
the president, Mrs. Ayers presid­
ing. i

Mrs. W. D. Kidd led in prayer.' 
Mrs. W. C. Gunter read the devo­
tional, Psalms 27th chapter. An­
nouncement and plans for a rum­
mage sale were made. The after­
noon was spent crocheting afagan 
squares to complete an afaghn for 
the Red Cross.

Those pre%‘nt were Mesdames 
Burton, Kidd, Palmer, Rainey, 
Gunter, Bromley, Bain, Talley, 
Keys, Head, Riney, Ayers. Host­
esses were Mrs. Talley, Mrs. Keys, 
Mrs. Bain and Mrs. Ayers.

In Our Market
QUALITY M i ATS

AT NO EXTRA COST
Try ear Grain fad Baby 
Baal for year next meal— 
thara'a a difference.

•  HOT BARBECUE
•  CHEESE SPREADS
•  LUNCH MEAT
*1 Pure Pork Sausage
•  SWEET PICKLES

CLARENDON
^  FO O D  STO R E * *
GROCERIES & MARKET

Crisco r  .75

FLOCK 
OWNERS

We are now selecting flocks 

from which to secure 

Hatching Eggs.
Got in touch w ith us at one* If you want your 
poultry flock blood-tasted and culled.

HARMONY CLASS
The Harmony Class of the Me­

thodist church met in their regu­
lar monthly meeting at the home 
of Mrs. B. G. Watson, Thursday, 
October 14 with Mrs. Watson as 
hostess and assisted by Mrs. J. R. 
Gillham.

Gallic* of 42 were enjoyed be­
fore the business session and Mrs. 
Cap Morris gave the devotional.

Lovely refreshments were serv­
ed to the following, Mesdames B. 
C. Antrobus, Carl Bennett Jr., Bill 
Ray, G. G. Reeves, O. C. Watson, 
C. B. Morris, M. L. Thornberry, 
Frank Phelan, Tom Goldston, R. 
S. Brumley, M. R. A liens worth, 
Walter Wilson and Miss Carrie 
Davis and the hostesses Mrs. Wat­
son and Mrs. Gillham.

Peaches 
Flour 
Lard

Gallon Cut

HOME QUEEN
JUS

24 lb. Sack . .*.

PURE HOG 
Bring your Pail 
,3-Points)
Pound ...........

.75

.98

Tomato Juice
Dal Mont*

GALLON CAN

L A R D
Sno Whit*

4 lb. Carton

6 9 c

Y A M S
Rod Volvots

WINDY VALLEY CLUB y
Miss Lola Ayers was hostess to 

the Windy Valley Club Thursday. 
One quilt was quilted. Nine mem­
bers present.

Mrs. W. B. Ayers received a 
polly anna gift.

Mrs. Gerald Reed will be host­
ess next meeting.

YOUNG PEOPLE'S 
CHOIR

The Young People's Choir met 
in their regular practice Monday 
night in the home of their sponsor, 
Mr. W. D. Kidd.

The attendance was off slight­
ly, but is expected to reach nor­
malcy next week.

All young people are cordially 
invited to attend Monday evening 
at 8 o'clock at Mr. Kidd’s home.

PATHFINDER CLUB
The Pathfinder Club will meet 

Friday, Oct 22 at 4:30 p. m. at the 
home of Mrs. J. H. Howze.

• • a a •

S P U D S
PECK

4 9 c
ONIONS

* £
Yellow

3 Pounds

2 0 c
WE DELIVER

CABBAGE
Firm Heads—Pound 3 c

V

Blackeyed Peas 1
Fresh—No. 2 Can .......................... i .  " L5 c
P E A S  1
Kuner—No. 2 Can ..........................  ...............  ™L5 c
C O R N  1
Brimful!—No. 2 Can .................................... ®

oID

Tomato Juice ^
No. 2 Can—» for .................................................™ >5c
SPINACH 1
No. 2ft C a n ................................  ..................... . ■ L9 c
PEACHES 27r
Conchas—No. 2ft Can __  ■  w #

O A T S
Whit* Swan

LARGE BOX

2 1 c
P E P

KELLOGGS
LARGE BOX

1 0 c
PRUNES

Dried

2 lbs. for

P E A R S
Dal Monte—No. 2ft Can 3 3 c
WE BUY CREAM. POULTRY, EGGS and HIDES

Macaroni

•  2 lb. Box

2 2 c
PHONE—43
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• Advertisements •

F O R  R E N T
FOR RENT — Good farm near 

Clarendon Hamed Sisters. 
Phono 288-W. (35-c)

KOR RENT—Unfurnished rooms. 
Phone 279-M. (35-p)

F O R  S A L E

PERMANENT WAVE KIT, $«<
Complete with 50 curlers, sham­
poo, curling solution, rinse and 
wave set. Hollywood Favorite. 

Stocking's Drug Store
(31-p)

PREVENT ROUP, * CHOLERA, 
COLDS, CANKER and mixed 
infections in chickens with a 
ONE-DOSE poultry vaccine. 

Stocking's Drug Store
(33-p)

FOR FISTULA and Poll Evil in 
horses use a guaranteed Fistula 
Remedy. Money refunded if not 
satisfied. For sale at

Stocking's Drug Store
(35-p)

WORM CHICKENS with Dr. Sals- 
bury’s ROTA-CAPS. For sale at 

Stocking's Drug Store
(35-p)

Disinfect hog lots, corrals, barns 
and chicken houses with CRE- 
SOTE DIP. Sold at

Stocking's Drug Store
(35-p)

HOUSEHOLD RUBBER GLOVES 
in all sizes. Ten dozen pair just 
received at

Stocking's Drug Store
(35-p)

AVENARIU8 C A R  BOLINUEM 
guaranteed to kill blue bugs and 
mites; also preserves wood and 
prevents termites.

Stocking's Drug Store
(35-p)

BLACKLEG with malignant 
oedema and SEPTICEMA with 
pulminary infection prevented 
with “2 in 1*’ bacterins. Offers 
double protection.

Stocking's Drug Store
(35-p)

FOR SALE by owner only, 800 
acres land $20.00 acre, everlast­
ing creek 4 miles north Claren­
don. Also 320 acres northeast 
part farm part grass. 160 acres 
all rich farm land east, will sell 
on terms or lease for cash. Write 
Mrs. E. P. Murrell, 1604-9th 
Wichita Falls, Texas. (37-p)

FOR SALE — White ripes and 
green tomatoes at $1.75 bushel. 
See Mrs. W. C. Reeves, Lelia 
Lake. (36-p)

FOR SALE — About 150 AAA 
White leghorn pullets, 4V4 to 
5H months old at 75c and $1.00. 
Also 50 brown leghorn and 12 or 
15 assorted laying hens, all last 
year pullets $1 each. Hoosier 
kitchen cabinet at $10. See Mrs. 
Joe Crawford, 1V6 miles north­
west of Hedley. (35-p)

Tone up stock and poultry pro­
duction by feeding Dr. LeGear’s 
nationally famous veterinary 
Prescriptions.

Stocking's Drug Stora
(35-p)

FOR SALE—12 AAAA English 
White Leghorn Roosters, $1.50 
each. Pink Marshall, Ashtola, 
Texas. (36-p)

FOR SALE—5 room house with 
bath. See D. M- Cook at Lelia 
Lake or phone 915-F11. (35-p)

FAMOUS WATKINS PRODUCTS
Earnings average $1.00 per hour. 

Car or experience not necessary. 
Write The J. R. Watkins Com­
pany, 70 - 74 W. Iowa, Memphis, 
Tennessee. (35-p)

PERM ANENT W AVE, 5 9 * ! Do
your own Permanent with 
Charm - Kurl ✓  Kit. Complete 
equipment, including 40 curlers 
and shampoo. Easy to do, abso­
lutely harmless. Praised by 
thousands including June Lang, 
glamorous movie star. Money 
refunded if not satisfied. 

Douglas It Goldston
(48-p)

GLASS—Call Hudson & Taylor to 
set your window glass and save 
money. Phone 82-M (34tfc)

FOR SALE—D-T Caibolated Cre- 
sote Base. Kills and Repels 
Mites, Fowl Ticks (Blue Bugs) 
and Rt pels Termites. Wood Pre­
server and Disinfectant 
Thomas Mill and Food Store 

(29-tfc)

FOR SALE—25 acres improved 
land in edge of town. Also team 
of horses. See C. T. McClenny.

(27-tfc)

LOST and FOUND
STRAYED OR LOST—Black bald 

face, four stocking leg saddle 
horse. Any person knowing the 
whereabouts of this horse please 
notify Roland Salmon, Brice, 
Texas. Finder will be repaid for 
trouble and feeding. (37-p)

FOR SALE— 330 gallon water 
tank. White Way Laundry.

(34tfc)

t TO OV* fTOM

act*
W ALL FINISH

Thompson Bros. Co.
Clarendon. Texas

GLASS — Window Glass, Wind- 
• shield, and Car Glgfs. Hudson 

A Taylor. Phone 82-M. . (34tfc)

WALL PAPER
< £ pp y* A.

1 7 5  N e w  P a tte rn s
« a a  - j A i s A S  *  - . , H 4

The moat complete selection of fine patterns in our 
many years in the paint and Wallpaper business.

LOWEST PRICES IN OUR ENTIRE HISTORY

Canvas for House Lining 8V2C Yd.

PAINT a

Oqr fin* lino of Quality Paints and Varnishes is on# of the moat complete 
stocks In the entire Panhandle. We went your business and have priced 
our entire line to save you money on every item.

A Paint for Every Purpose

UNOLEUM
Special price on our entire stock of Prints, inlaid Linoleum,

S

and Ruga—this week only.

GLASS
s

New Stock Just arrived. Call us to set that window glass before cold weather 

A UTO  GLASS, PLATE GLASS and MIRRORS.

fW NITURE
VISIT OUR FURNITURE DEPARTMENT. .

We will buy your used furniture. Call us.

PAINTING, PAPER HANGING, DECORATING
«

CALL US FOR ESTIMATES

H U D S O N  & T A Y L O R

J -

Phone tt-M Opposite Poet Office

LOST—Small white female dog.
Looks similar to Scottie. Long 

white hair with,'black spot on 
ear. Liberal reward. Finder 
notify S. T. Nichols or phone 
342. (35-p)

W A N T E D
WANTED— Used Furniture and 

stoves. We pay you cash or in 
trade. Whitlock Furniture Co.

(32-c)
WANTED— Will pay cash for 

good used wire clothes hangers. 
Unlimited quantity needed. 
Parsons Broa. (9-tfc)

WANTED—We will pky top prices 
for your used furniture. Hudson 
St Taylor. Phone 82-M. (28tfc)

WANTED— Empty feed sacks. 
Thomas Mill St Feed Store.

(31tfc)
WANTED—Call us for estimates 

on Painting, Paperhanging and 
decorating. Quality materials 
and skilled workmanship at rea­
sonable prices. Hudson & Tayloi 
Phone 82-M. (28tfc)

Sewing Machines Repaired. Any 
make. All work done at store. 
Thompson Bros. Co. (13-tfc)

Large Crowd Sees 
Alaskan Pictures

A large appreciative crowd was 
in attendance at the College Audi­
torium Monday night to see the 
colored film scenes of Alaska 
shown by Jack Lamb, world fam­
ous sportsmen and traveler. The 
auditorium was filled to capacity, 
many having to stand in the door­
ways and hall. Many expressed 
their appreciation for having had 
the opportunity to see these won­
derful and beautiful scenes of 
Alaska.

As the film ran 51* course, the 
silent grandeur of -the far north 
was brought to tlHK' showirlj a 
land of splendor, inhabited by 
thousands of wild . animals and 
birds which had never laid eyes 
on man before. The running 
streams and lakes were filled 
with thousands of fish—a place 
which fisherrhen dream of. Great 
snow-covered mountain peaks 
reached heavenward, defying with 
brutal aspect the encroachment of 
the Intruder. The fascinating sun­
set with its fiery splendor chal­
lenged the northland wonders as 
its golden rays repainted the dist­
ant mountain peaks.

Mr. Lamb told the audience that 
it was through the insistence of 
Mayor Tom Connally that the pic­
ture was brought to Clarendon.

Rev. and Mrs. L. Guy Ament 
and their daughter, Mrs. Jacobus 
and her son Guy, left Friday night 
for Dallas where1 Mrs. Jacobus 
will work in the Juliette Fowler 
Orphans Home. Rev. and tyre. 
Ament will visit also at Waco and 
plan'to return home Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Merchant 
and daughter Jacqueline toe re 
down from Pampa visiting his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Cal Mer­
chant.

Mrs. W. A. Davis is visiting her 
childrpn at Amarillo.

Mrs. J. R. Bartlet and daughter. 
Marilyn and Mrs. Earl Lea were 
Childress visitors Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Gilmer Ayers and 
children Laquita and Gail were in 
Amarillo Monday.

LATEST RESCUE TECHNIQUE, invenled by Brjuin’.  R.A.F., ii to drop 
lilcboata from reicue planet. The boat! float down by parachute! to American, 
Britith or other Allied airmen who have crethed at tea. When they clamber 
eboard, the men find food, tuppliet, and an enfine which enable! them to retch 
■ home port. Many airmen already owe their livei to thii infleniout ertit.

f O C A L S
Mrs. S. W. Lowe has returned 

home from a visit with her moth­
er, Mrs. W. J. Aiken at Dallas. 
Mrs. Aiken came home with her 
for a ten-day visit.

Mrs. R. M. Morris and Mrs. 
Wade Hilliard visited in Amarillo 
the first of the week. They return­
ed home Monday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. C. M. Carpenter 
of Sweetwater visited over the 
week end with Mrs. Carpenter’s 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Craw­
ford.

Miss Lela Clifford of Pampa 
spent the week end visiting her 
mother, Mrs. W. T. Clifford.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Merchant 
and small daughter of Pampa 
were down for the week end visit­
ing his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Cal 
Merchant.

Lieut. Geo. Chamberlain and 
wife and two children from Camp 
Davis, North Carolina, are visiting 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. F. E. 
Chamberlain for a few days be­
fore going on to a new post in 
California.

Mrs. R. W. Bingham from Ver­
non visited in the R. C. Bingham 
home over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. R. O. Johnson of 
St. Louis is visiting her mother, 
Mrs. R. W. Fowlkes. They are en- 
route to California to visit their 
son, R. O. Johnson Jr., who is in 
the service.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Hunt and 
children attended a lovely dinner 
at the home of Oscar Bagwell, 
honoring A. C. Paul Scoggins, 
Sunday. ^ 1

------------------------- -------
Sgt. Mprvin Jones of Lubbock 

is home on a three-day furlough 
visiting his moth«K.

Mrs. Ernest Hunt and children. 
Miss Carrie Da via and Donna Rea 
Bryan attended the T. D. Nored 
Jr. funeral at Millington, Sat.

Mr. and Mrs. O. C. Watson Sr. 
and Mrs. Lena Antrobus were 
joined by their son O. C. Watson 
Jr. in Amarillo for a visit. He was 
on his way to Lubbock for an ex­
amination for the Navy.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Almond 
visited in Memphis and Childress 
Sunday.

USE BOOK FOUR 
NOVEMBER 1

Housewives will start using 
green stamps A, B and C from 
new War Ration Book Four, Mon­
day, November 1. These stamps 
will be valid through December 
20 and will be used for buying 
processed foods in the same way 
as the blue stamps in Book Two. 
The last blue stamps in Book Two 
(X, Y) remain good through No­
vember 20. Book Four is .being 
distributed the latter part of Oc­
tober—the exact time and place 
being announced locally. One in­
dividual may apply for Book Four 
for all members of his family re­
siding at the same address. The 
applicant must have a War Ration 
Book Three with him for each 
person for whom he wishes to ob­
tain a Book Four.

How to Buy Your 
Baby Chicks

Rush business that hatcheries 
had last seas, in will probably be 
repeated this coming season, re­
ported J. R. Gillham, Agriculture 
teacher. To avoid difficulty in se­
curing the number and quality of 
chicks desired, the poultryman 
should make his orders as far 
ahead of delivery date as possible.

Before making an order a few 
precautions that may largely de­
termine the success of a proposed 
poultry enterprise should be ob­
served very carefully, said Gill- 
ham.

First, buy chicks as close to 
home as possible. If the kind or 
breed of chicks wanted cannot be 
secured in this locality, try not to 
go outside the state to make the 
purchase. The kind of poultry that 
will do best on the farms in this 
area can be found in Texas.

Some causes for baby chick 
losses can be completely elimin­
ated by proper buying. For ex­
ample, no chicks should be lost 
from pullorm disease. Chicks 
should be bought from flocks that 
have been properly tested for this 
disease under an effective private 
testing program or under the Na­
tional Poultry Improvement Plan.

Most hatcheries have strict 
minimum qualifications that they 
meet before chicks are sold. 
Nevertheless, a buyer should 
check his sourci of chicks closely 
in order to insure the delivery of 
quality birds. If a buyer has no 
means of making a check on the 
sources that provide the particular 
kind of fowl he wants, he might 
want to order from hatcheries that 
are in the Poultry Improvement 
Plan program since these busi­
nesses are regularly checked by a 
State Inspector.

The items for which a hatchery 
or breeder should be checked, 
states Gillham, include the free­
dom from pullorum disease, the 
production of the flock, the weight 
of the eggs, size of the hens, 
breeding characteristics of the 
hens, and if possible, the perform­
ance of some birds previously 
bought from that source.

Mrs. Holt and children are visit­
ing her mother, Mrs. Karl Adams.

Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Beard have 
moved to Dallas and are working 
there.

Mrs. David Johnson is visiting 
her daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Grady Holbert at Crowell 
this week.

Mrs. Haskel Kemp has returned 
home from medical treatment at 
Shawnee, Okla.

Mrs. Allen Jefferies is with her 
father, Frank Collinson at El Paso 
who is very ill.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Blair and 
Mrs. Bill Bentley were shopping 
in Amarillo one aay this week.

Mrs. Ruth Rhodes and son are 
visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Butler.

Maxine Ellis is in Wichita, Kan­
sas, illustrating draftsman in the 
Boeing Airplane Co.

S/Sgt. Ray Palmer is in San 
Anita, Calif, attending an auto­
motive school.

Mrs. O. D. Stanley of Abilene 
was in Clarendon visiting rela­
tives the week end.

C O L D
W e a th e r

A H E A D

L E T  U S  
C O M P L E T E L Y

4

Winterize
Y O U R  C A R

NOW
1 __ .. *

Plenty Anti-Freeze -  Battery 

Lubricant Change 

Wash and Grease

CLYDE WILSOft
SINCLAIR SERVICE STATION
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ROUND-THE-CIOCK AIR RAIDS ovtr
Germany ami Simtb Pacific . . . Every 
time you read this headline in your news­
paper, remember that United Nations 
war planes are vastly improved war 
weapons because their tanks arc filled 
with 100 octane gasoline from the 
United States.

To say that this super-fuel is equiva­
lent to a fifth engine in every four- 
engine bomber is actually «nJrrstating 
the facts! Compared with German avia­
tion fuel of H7 octane, it improves 
performance more than 25 per cent.

Long peacetime research for new and 
better things from petroleum genes, as 
well as from petroleum, prepared 
Phillips for an important role in war­
time production. Phillips Petroleum

Company was among the first to take 
100 octane gasoline.. .  as well as buta­
diene for synthetic rubber . . . out of 
the laboratory and into mass production.

Twenty-four hours a day, our best 
efforts are devoted to the production of 
these and other synthetic chemicals 
which will bring closer that great day 

/when once again you can say "Fill ‘tr 
up". . . and the service man will crank 
into your tank a  new and improved 
Phillips gasoline.

Until then, every time you sec the 
Phillips 66 Shield, let it remind you that 
Phillips refineries in addition to pro­
ducing gasolines, lubricants, fuel oils, 
are also gigantic chemical plants pouring 
out weapons for victory.
Phillips P e t r o l e u m  Co ., B*nUnilU, Oil*.

Income From 
Livestock , 
Outlined

Prospects of good incomes for 
Texas livestock owners during the 
remainder of this year have been 
outlined by Dr. F. A. Buechel, 
economic analyst of the Univer­
sity of Texas Bureau of Business 
Research.

Since inventories of cattle in 
Texas at the beginning of 1943 
were slightly larger than at the 
first of 1942, and since shipments 
to date in 1943 have been only a 
little higher than for the previous 
year, it seems certain that ship­
ment of cattle will hold up well 
during the rest of the year, Dr. 
Buechel explained.

High marketings of sheep will 
also probably continue, he pre­
dicted. Excellent prices have giv­
en sheepmen an opportunity to 
cull over-age ewes from their 
herds, he said.

Shortages of feed will have two 
effects on Texas ranchmen, the 
economist declared—the first will 
be less demand for Texas cuttle 
and calves from feeders in the 
cornbelt area. In the second place, 
increased marketihgs of hogs will 
not bring an increased income 
since most hogs are now being 
shipped to market at a lower 
weight than norma 1 because of 
lack of feed.

FOR VICTORY... Buy U. S. War Bonds and Stamps

Seven Food 
Groups Are Keys 
To Health

4
To help housewives tell at a 

glance whether their families are 
getting the right foods every day, 
the War Food Administration has 
designed a Nutrition Target, 
scientifically arranged for quick 
planning of healthful menus.

With the aid. any cook easily 
can see whether her meals contain 
something from each of the seven 
groups of foods that scientists 
have discovered are essential for 
good health. By eating some food 
from each group every day. a nu­
tritionally sound diet may be 
achieved.

In wartime especially, the Nu­
trition Target has an important 
function. It is often necessary to

make subsitutions in mesus. Sup. 
pose ydlt had planned a meal of 
grapefruit juice, steak, green 
beans, carrits, potatoes, and bread 
and butter with cheese for dessert. 
But you couldn't get the juice, 
steak, or potatoes. What would 
you substitute?

A look at the Target gives you 
the answer. Instead of steak, you 
might have poultry, fish, eggs, or 
baked beans. Instead of grapefruit 
juice, you could substitute a raw 
cabbage salad. And instead of po­
tatoes, you might use cauliflower, 
parsnips, or summer squash. The 
resulting meal would still be bal­
anced and nutritious.

The facts of good nutrition are 
simple and easy to learn. They 
have been condensed into the 
“National Wartime Nutrition 
Guido.” a folder containing the 
Nutrition Target, lists of foods in 
each group, and hints on conserv­
ing food. This folder is handy for

the housewife to have in her 
pocketbook when she goes to 
market.

Copies of the “National War­
time Nutrition Guide” may be ob­
tained from any regional office of 
the Food Distribution Adminis­
tration or from the local nutrition 
committee.

ABSTRACTS •  LOANS 
and REAL ESTATE

Donley County Abstract Company 
C. E. KILLOUGH 

Phone 44

CIVIL SERVICE . 
ANNOUNCEMENT

The position of Price Specialist 
of lumber, $3800 per anlSum, with 
the Regional Office, Office of
Price Administration, Region V 
which comprises the states of 
Texas, Louisiana, Kansas, Miss 
ouri, Oklahoma and Arkansas. 
Dallas Texas, will be filled by 
Civil Service procedures, Elmer 
G. Hayos, local civil service secre­
tary announced today.

Applicants must have had at 
least five years of recent respon­
sible full-time paid experience in 
the production and distribution of 
lumber.

Applications must be filed on or 
before the close of business Oc­
tober 25, 1943, with the director, 
10th U. S. civil service region, 210 
S. Harwood Street, Dallas 1, Tex.

Glen Allison left for San Fran­
cisco Friday night after a furlough 
visit with his mother, Mrs. J. L. 
Allison.

It liWi!lltlllllllHlllitt!llhra| I'

FIX-UP FOR COLD WEATHER AHEAD
• • o

Don’t let the first cold snap catch you napping. Now is the time to fix-up 
and Repair to keep that cold weather out. It will save on your fuel bill as 
well as make your home more liveable. Use Pittsburgh Paint, both on the 
inside and out. You will be surprised at the difference it w ill make.

F o x w o rth  - G a lb ra ith

Mrs. Nina Gates from Amarillo 
spent the week end visiting her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Craw­
ford.

Mrs. M. W. Stevenson and child­
ren was visitors in the Bill Craw­
ford home Sunday.

Winter Care 
Of Orchards

The winter months, when fruit 
trees are dormant, is the best sea­
son to prepare the farm orchard 
for next year’s production, says 
J. F. Rosborough, horticulturist 
for the A AM College Extension 
Service.

According to dietitians, two 
servings of fruit daily are needed 
to maintain a person’s health. 
Fruits are a free source of vita­
mins, and also supply iron and 
calcium as well as other minerals 
for blood, bone and body process­
es.

To obtain highest yields trees 
should be treated now for harm­
ful pests and surface diseases like 
borers and scale. Gummy exuda­
tions filled with sawdust pellets at 
the ground line of a tree is symp­
tomatic of borrer damage. Ros­
borough recommends paradichlo- 
ro-benzene, commonly called 
PDB, as most effective against 
borers when used from the middle 
of October to midi November.

No soil preparation is necessary 
in administering this treatment 
except to break the crust for 15 to 
18 inches around the tree and re­
move any grass or weeds. Place 
the PDB crystals in a circle about 
three inches from the trunk. For 
mature trees one ounce is used, 
and for young trees one half an 
ounce is enough. The crystals 
should be covered with dirt im­
mediately after being applied, and 
firmly packed with the back of a 
shovel to make a cone-shaped 
mound. The cone should be torn 
down after six weeks and the re­
maining crystals removed.

If only a few trees are infested,

the simplest treatment for scale is 
a wash composed of two and one 
half tablespoons of lye in one gal­
lon of water. This may be applied 
to the affected parts with an old 
paint brush. More extensive scale 
infestation in a large orchard may 
be dealt with by spraying during 
the winter with oil emulsion or 
concentrated lime sulphur.

DRAFT DELINQUENTS 
TO BE INDUCTED

Beginning November 1, all men 
18 to 38 years of age who are sub­
ject to selective service but who 
are delinquent will be put into 
class. 1-A immediately and order­
ed to report for induction, the Se­
lective Service Bureau of the War 
Manpower Commission has stated.

Donley County Leader. $2 a year.

A T  FIR S T  
SIGN OF A

THE STATE OF TEXAS
TO Louida Hubenthal Tully, De­
fendant, Greeting: .

You are hereby commanded to 
appear before the Honorable 100th 
District Court of Donley County 
at the Court House thereof, in 
Clarendon, Texas, at or before 10 
o’clock A. M. of the first Monday 
next after the expiration of forty- 
two days from the date of the is­
suance of this citation, same being 
the 15th day of November A. D. 
1943, then and there to answer 
Plaintiff's Petition filed in said 
Court, on the 27th day of Septem­
ber A. D. 1943, in this cause, num 
bered 2214 on the docket of said 
court and styled Wilbern Tully 
Plaintiff, vs. Louida Hubenthal 
Tully Defendant.

A brief statement of the nature 
of this suit is as follows, to wit: 
Suit for Divorce because of cruel 
treatment as is more fully shown 
by Plaintiff's Petition on file in 
this suit.

The officer executing tMs pro­
cess shall promptly execute the 
same according to law, 2nd make 
due return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my 
hand and the Seal of said Court, 
at office in Clarendon, Texas this 
the 28th day of September A. D. 
1943.

Attest: - 
HELEN WIEDMAN 

(Seal) Clerk District Court, 
Donley County, Texas 
By Walker Lane 
Deputy.

(35-c)

Dr. J. Gordon Stewart
PHYSICIAN 8. SURGEON

Offica in Latson Bldg 
Ground Floor 

Office Phono 239 

Residence Phono 253

c

ov»
USE 666

666 TABLETS. S ALV E. NOSE DROPS

__Thursday, October 21, 1943
ODT WARNS AGAINST 
HARMFUL ANTI-FREEZE

\ I rOperators of all kinds of motor 
vehicles have been warned by 
ODT against the Vise of harmful 
salt or oil preparations as radiator 
anti-freeze. Salt anti-freez solu­
tions may cause corrosion or 
shorting of electrical circuits.

J. A. WARREN
AGENCY

writing oil linos of Insuronco 
except fire.

HOSPITALIZATION
INSURANCE

Logoi forms, bookkeeping, 
audits, income tax service.

General office and clerical work.

203 Goldston Sldg. 
Clarendon, Texas

INSURANCE
FIRE •  TORNADO •  HAIL •  AUTO

AND ALL KINDRED LINES/
BONDS •  NOTARY PUBLIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO.
Phone 11 i-i C. C. Powell

U l

A FEED for EVERY NEED
When you need any kind of feed for stock or poultry he 
sure to inspect our stock, for we guarantee it to be good.

Custom Grinding
We are equipped to do your grinding any way you waul 
it done. Profit more by grinding.

Thomas Mill & Feed Store

YOUR CREDIT LUMBER DEALER
J. K. MORTON. Mgr. Phono 21

IN THE DISTRICT COURT-OF 
DONLEY COUNTY, TEXAS

TOM REEDER
ys. NO. 2218

OLETA REEDER 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 
To Oleta Reeder:

You are commanded to appear 
and answer the plaintiffs petition 
at or before 10 o’clock a. m. on the 
first Monday after the expiration 
of forty-two days from the date 
of issuance hereof, the same being 
Monday, the 6th day of December, 
1943 before the Honorable 100th 
District Court of Donley County, 
Texas at the Court House in Clar­
endon, Texas.

Said suit was filed the 20th day 
of October, 1943.

The style of the suit: Tom 
Reeder, Plaintiff, vs. Oleta Reeder, 
Defendant

The suit is for a divorcement of 
the bonds of matrimony now ex­
isting between Tom Reeder, 
Plaintiff and Oleta Reeder, De­
fendant and the statutory grounds 
of such divorcement is cruel treat­
ment

Given under my hand and seal 
of said <?ourt at office in Claren­
don, Texas, this the 20th day of 
October, 1943 and issued this, the 
same date.

Clerk of District Court, 
Helen Wiedman,

(Seal) Donley County, Texas 
By Walker Lane,

Deputy.
(38-c)

H is le t tke>

yld d  Up
MACARONI .
PILOT—6 Boxes 1 9 c PEANUT

COFFEE
ADMIRATION—3 pounds 7 8 c BUTTER

2 lb. Jar

TOMATO JUICE
40 os. 2 2 c 5 5 c

Cabbage 
Flour

For Kraut Making

10 lbs.
Also chow-chow tomatoes

.29
AMERICAN BEAUTY

48 lbs..................$2 .25
24 lbs. ........................ ... $125

H i g h
Quality Meats

SMOAQI ft 33C 
lb 45c 

1b 35c

CURED HAM
Slicsd

LOIN
STEAK

Y A M S
Pound 6 c
M E A L
WHITE—10 lbs. 4 5 c
APPLES Doz.........25c & 3 5  c

NEXT DOOR TO COUNTY AGENT’S OFFICE
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SOPHOMORES SPONSOR 
CHAPEL PROGRAM 
OCTOBER 15

V

all our other fine' orgnnizntitW ’ HIGH SCHOOL JUNIORS
have combined and arc all agreed 
on the importance of teaching th*
characteristic to all the oricoming 
generations so that America may 
remain a free and happy nation.

Perhaps the largest'part of the 
credit for the embedding of this 
trait in American youth goes to 
our splendid school systems. From

SPORTSMANSHIP
(An Editorial)

By La Hue Shadle
Sportsmanship is one of the best 

traits a person can have. It is par- 
ticularly typical of Americans In 
World War I, the American sold­
ier was honored in France on the 
battle line, in Germany in the 
Army of Occupation, or wh- rover 
he' happened to be. for his honest 
chivalry, his sympathetic under­
standing of situations, his bravery, 
and his graceful acceptance of re­
sults. These are the essences of 
real sportsmanship, Tin- American 
soldiers of World War II are noted 
for these same traits.

Everyday American sees the re­
sult of having taught her youth 
the quality of Sportsmanship. The 
home, the church, the school, and

Be Quick To Treat 
Bronchitis

Chronic bronchitis muv develop if J, 
ywircough,chest cold.oraeute bron- “ 8*’ *he sophomores salute these 
ehltls is not treated and you cannot ! swell sports, 
afford to takes chance with anvmedi-
rtno toss potent than Cmuhulsion Sportsmanship is not a trait

peculiar to the freshmen; it Is evi- trouble to help loosen and ernel germ i , ,, . , ,laden phlegm and aid nature to I d<*nt ^'tougbout the whole school 
soothe and heol raw,tender. Inflamed i body. It is a fine characteristic branchial mucous membranes.

Creomulston blenrlM bcechwood 
creosote" 
time

colleges and universities fair jilay 
and sportsmanship never cease to 
be taught.

A good example of sportsman­
ship was shown last Friday by 
over thirty of the Clarendon Jr. 
College freshmen during their 
initiation by the old timers, th# 
sophomores. Regardless of whtit 
horrible regalia they were forced 
to weor, they came twdding up 
the steps of the ole’ brick school 
building and began hauling books 
and obeying the every beck and, 
cull of the sophomores As the day 
wore on, insult was added to in­
jury, but the freshmen took It nil 
in good spirits and smiled through

ota by special process with other 
tested medlrtm . for coutrhscoughs.

It contains no narcotic *
Wo matter how many medicines 'CHAPEL PROGRAM  

you have triad, tell your druggist to | a t  id  m r u  nU you a bottle of Creomulslon with 'tha undemanding vou must like the way it auicklv allnvs the cough, per­mitting rest and sleep, or vou are to haye your money back. <Adv.)

DR. H. R. BECK
D E N T I S T

Rhone 46

9 to 12—Office hours—I to 5  ̂

Goldston Bldg. 

Clarendon. Tanks

Dm

SPONSOR PROGRAM 
FOR OCTOBER 8

' By Mary Well Keys
The high school Juniors had the 

chapel program last Friday. First 
on the program was Gejfe Bryan 
who sang “Pistol-Packin' Mama’’ 
accompanied by Manly Bryan As 

the kindergarten on through our art encore Gene fê ng “In My
Arms*’ Which w»s equally as good 
as his first song! Neitt there wks 
a comet sblo, “Star Dust" by Cam! 
Brumley played In his best Harry 
James style. There was also a skit 
entitled “Matrimonii Music." The 
script was read by Jack Ballew 
while the music Was supplied by 
Edith McCrary at the piano, Ruth 
Patman and her flute, Robert 
Naylor and his clalrnet. Jean Por­
ter and her saxaphohe, musical 
flute, and oeariha, and Billy Jean 
Knox and Gertrude Galcote with 
their singing. The next number 
tv as a pfano sold by Edith Mc­
Crary; she played "Cow-CoW 
Boogie” in true jazz style. Billy 
Jean Knox and Gertrude Calcote 
came back next to sing "There’ll 
be Blue Birds Over the White 
Cliffs yf Dover” and “Little Cut's 
Tail.” Next was another skit 
which was an announcement «f a 
football game between the Brun­
ch os- and Lcfors Pirates. Bob 
Bentley was tire announcer, and 
some of the girts in the pep squad 
furnished the cheers Jean Porter 
gave a clever reading.

The program Was highlighted 
by the trek across the stage of the 
college freshmen in their initia­
tion togs. Some of the best ones 
were; If. C Shaw, who represent­
ed a sweater girl and incidentally 
marie a very good one; Troy M<>f- 
fet as Daisy Mae and Wassel Ma­
son who was Li!' Abjicr, Helen 
Porter made a fetching shine girl 
and by the way’, she made some 
money too; Billy Lowe made an 
excellent Mae West with his short 
dinner dress and picture hat; Peg­
gy Stewart was a good “Old Wom­
an Who Lived in the Shot ” with 
dolls for children; Henrietta Guy 
looked Just like Carman Mirande 
with aU-hcr costume jewelry;

and it will live as long as the 
American way of life survives.

Mrs Burton had charge of the 
chapel program Friday, Oct. 15th 
First we sang “The Eyes of Tex­
as,” “Army Air Corps,” and "Ovor 
There.” Fay Powell said a reading. 
The Quartet composed of Mary 
Ann Bromley, Ruby Jo Kidd, 
Ardith Warren, and Arvmrine 
Smith, accompanied by Dclcnc 
Blair, sang “Sunday Monday or 
Always” and “There’s A Star 
Spangled Banner Waving Soma- 
where .” Merle Holland of Senior 
High vaid a reading Judge King 
made a very interesting talk Mike 
Smith lead the pledge td the flag 
That concluded the program.

- . . ( 
Javan Tucker was swcjl ‘‘Model”;! 
Dorothy Kuunody was the ideal 
cotton pi,ckvr; Eleanor Blusingume 
had at least sixteen pigtails, each 
one tied with a different colored 
ribbon. There w e re  m a n y  oth<T 
cleyer costumes seen in the pa­
rade. Louise Moss wore a colorful 
Indian costume.. And there were 
many more that wo haven't time 
to tell about.

DonUy County Leader, $2 a year,

JR. HIGH NEWS
In Miss pardon's seventh" gjade 

Tommy Murphy has sold his 
calves. He plains to spend more 
time studying now.

Joan Thompson went to Ama­
rillo shopping Saturday. We ex­
pect her to set the fashions for the 
seventh grade.

Gene Bryan had guests from 
Amarillo Sunday.

In Mrs. Lowry's eighth grade 
there are two new pupils, Mary 
Brewer and Dorthy Perry.

SOUTH WARD NEWS
Mrs. Mcars’ room has a new 

pair of book end* for their reading 
tahle. They got them with their 
first book of green stamps.

Miss Mongole's room is making 
Hallowe'en art work ' and fruit 
They are beginning on picture 
study.

Mrs. Prewitt’s room has two 
now pupils, Tneala Noble. Rcdley, 
Texas and Dorthy Jones, Paris. 
Texas.
, In Miss St. vons’ room Bobby 

Parker, Goldstou, left. The pupils 
are working on Hallowe'en cats 
and oyvls for their room.

Mrs. Bain’s sixth grade will 
have their P.-T.A. program n 
week from this Thursday.

F. F. A. NEWS
By Billy Christie

Joe Barns wag elected Parlia­
mentarian to fill a recent vacancy. 
A committee was appointed to 
plan an FF.A social. Several 
other items of business were dis­
cussed at a regular meeting of 
Clarendon Chapter of Future 
Farmer* uf America. October bill

1500 
F O R T S ”

for
TOKYO and BERLIN
Zhat's What We’re ‘Doing to

BLAST the AXIS I

-

Reddy TYist’s the way we’re spending onr 
wage*.

F**: What are your wage*, Reddy?

Reddy; Your electric hill, the smiiH sum yon 
pay me for the jobs ! do for yon daily.

Fee; Bnt jn*t how do you convert them Into 
fort* to *end oter Berlin and Tokyo?

Reddy; Like thi*: Fifteen cents ont of every 
dollar yon tttm over to me my complitiy 
ttims over to the federal government as 
taxes—which in tettns of the entire Industry 
means over 400 mtilfan dnHars. And that’s 
ktWtJQti m  BUY MORE THAN 1500 
G lA ftf LUMBERS—at a tjoarter-nffTHon 
each I

Too: lliat’s really Mastin’ ’em!
Reddy; Altogether from every dollar you pay 

ns, we pass along 8?* more for local and state 
taxes—which totals about 24ff out of every 
dollar.

Foil But how do you manage?
Reddy; By business mnfinyemenl under free 

enterprise—that’s how!• j»-

TrtAT system Is Supplying the trains, the know­
how and manning (he production lines that turn
Oilt the 1500 Forts!

Stay A m m a n
— - -  U.

WestTexas U tilities
Company

_______

By Helen Portsr
The high school sophomores had 

chyigv of the chapel program Fri­
day. 15th. The program was a 
swell ony, and everyone is very 
proud qf the sophomores for giv­
ing such a grand hour of enter­
tainment,

Sylvia Faye Morgan gave a 
humorous reading at which every­
one laughed.

France* Peabody and Barbara 
Bell sung 'Stormy Weather.” Bar­
bara accompanied on the piano 
also.

Tom Goodlier wrote im original 
English essay on “Noses.” Every­
one wanted him tc> give it. in 
chapel. The essay surely showed 
Turn’s wit and humor, but hg 
could probably write a more 
formal essay if he wanted to.

A short playlet was also put oiv 
"Paul Faces the Tire Shortage” 
was the name of it.

Characters;
Mr Jones— A defense plant 

worker William Jacobs.
Mrs. Jones Nelta Lois Cowan.
Majy Jones Their attractive 

daughter who has bo n studying! 
home nursing- Ads Sue Smith.

Junior Mary's kid brother on 
whom stie practices — Jimmy 
Douglas.

Paul Tire oldest Jones child, 
who lias many social problems— 
Lee Shelley.

Jane—'Paul's favor it girl friend 
—Dorthy Jean Tatum.

After tlie regular program wax 
over, Mr. Dunnan called on thq 
football boys to suy what they j 
thought of tilt game Friday night.I 
Everyone had the same idea about 
"going in there and fighting.'' Thqj 
speeches must have done the boys 
good, since they really did “fight 
and win.”

Outlook Good For 
Holiday Turkeys

News from the* turkey front is 
good. Plan* for Thanksgiving and 
Christum* dinners may innliide' tul dove loping

I tur keys and take advantage both 
j of the higher price per pound and 
the additional weight gained. 
There is no field of livestock pro­
duction, he  adds, which will pay 
a greater return at present than 
feeding turkeys for market. A 

1 turkuy-devt loping mash plus
the normal quota of druinsmis ^rain will do a good job of fatten- 
and white incat because Texas | «*• w  0 commercial fattening ra- 
growt rs are expected to produc Uun may “ UbL‘̂
3,750,00l» birds this year. This,, Urst results will he obtained if 
says George P. McCarthy who, die turkeys are confined to a 
made the forouaat, "means plenty j am;4ij mv.i to prevent walking i fl
of turkey meat for our soldiers 
and plenty for civilians.”

All turkeys being marketed 
now are taken by the army, but 
approximately 05 percent of this 
demand has.been met and the rv

extra Ruin. A trap of one to five 
acres, depending upon size of 
flock, would be suitable. Mc­
Carthy recommends giving a flock 
woinier in the mush for several 
days to reduce par asite infestation

More Vitamins 
Disovered

Two more of the life-essential 
B vitamins have been discovered 
by the Biochemical Institute of 
the University uf Texas during 
thu past three years of research 
Dr. R. J. Williams, director, has 
reported.

Folic acid and pscudopyridnxin 
are the two vjUunins discovered 
in Institute laboratories— folic
acid lias been publicized as the 
“Popeye” vitamin because of it? 
presence in spinach. It is believed 
to be very impel Unit in combat­
ting certain types of anemia.

Tlie Blocht nucai Institute has 
been partially financed for three 
yews by the Clayton Foundation 
for Research. Plans for the future, 
Dr. Williams rovcnJ, include fur- 
thi r extensive study of vitamins 
and their relationships to cancer.

iw Hinder will be liquidated by No*; and get bettor Rains. Hut once tin 
veniber 1. Meanwhile, many pro- : lueding program tori f<- d 
ducwrs behove tiial current mar- 1 should lc-mein before the birds 
ki?t quotations on top grade justify i for free choice feeding until they 
putting “a real finish on their ttu- ; are marketed Five pounds of feed 
keys.” Tlie present market for should produce one touml of gain.
grade A young turkeys is 30 to 32 -------- ~--------------- —
cent?, and 24 to 25 cents for Mr. and Mrs. HersChcl Heath re­
grade C. | turned to their home Sunday at

It is a good investment, saysiOkla. City, aftci a visit with hi 
McCarthy who i$ poultrynmn fof I parents, Mr. and Mrs. Grnv r 
the ArLM College Extension Sir-, Heath. Hi is employed in Douglas 
vice, to feed to produce Grade A ' Aircraft

FOR SALE
80 Acres, joins town section

GOOD IMPROVEMENTS

42 Acres, joins town section
MODERN 5 ROOM HOUSE 

Yard landscaped and planted.

Friends of Mrs. C. II. Skinner 
will be glad to learn that she was 
brought home from tlie Clanmlon 
Clinic Sunday. She is resting very 
well. Mrs. M. D. Buchanan is stay­
ing with iter.

Easy to ripply Quick to set. 
Stop* pink eye" Iojms. A 5-gmm 
OulUe—enough to treat 30 to 40 
cases—$1.0p-

JhiOttyA
Calf Prescription 

For the treatment of dietary 
diarrhea A Urn# tested formula,
Gets tha Job dona. Large bottle—  
4& ouncgae-ll.OO,

A t 'O.tngsL
Sulfa Powder 4 

A sulfa drug preparation for 
anim al wounds. Promotes rrom pt 
healing. Convenient shaker can—  
3 Ti ounces—$100. >(th J,r _

giiibtiao*’ AaimaJ HeaUh PM- 
ducts are made toy prncUcsl cat­
tle people, tasted us their < wa  herb and saasaaiead ta pet ttos
M> den# in yaaas. Wa are pr ud
to be Use exclaatva ageacy to 
our town for this Una of out* 
stendior original produeto. Drop 
to any time and tat «  aba*  
them to you and explain their 
Marita.

tH E REX ALL STORE
Phone 36

Priced to Sell
IM M ED IATE POSSESSION

Geo. Ryan
Next door to Watson 8c Antrobus

itiillillllili!!! S I!

A winner 
over any course...

ifie Stetson
"Asheville"

Light-weight masterpiece for active men 
who move /an t. . .  work and play hard. 
Combiftoa comfort and smart appearance 

1_ . . .  and ketpg tit ?uiarlnt»8 hocauae of tho
__  exclusive Stetson Vita-Felt* Process.

SIOop

BRYAN CLOTHING CO.
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P A G tB O R T .

Pre-Season Care 
For Orchards

Care of orchards is a ‘round-the- 
year job. Fruit trees and vines 
should be tended during the non­
production season in order to 
make possible abundant yield in 
the fruiting period, says H. M. 
Breedlove, County Agent for the 
A&M College Extension Service.

Planting winter cover crops is a 
good beginning. Experiment Sta­
tion tests show that twenty 
pounds of vetch will produce the 
equivalent of three hundred

pounds of nitrate of soda an acre. 
And in addition to its fertiliser 
value, vetch turned under in the 
spring will add several tons of 
humus material to orchard soil 
which is* valuable during the 
growing season.

Type of soil affects the choice of 
winter cover crops. Hairy vetch 
does well in the sandy soil of east 
Texas, but should be planted only 
in areas of adequate rainfall. 
Clover thrives best in the heavy 
soils of south and central Texas, 
and rye, oats and wheat, being 
tolerant of drought, are recom­
mended for west Texas. These 
crops should be planted in early

i J

S H O P
And S A V E  a t

CLIFFORD & RAY’S

LARGEST SELECTION OF

Quality Foods

fall and turned under at blossom­
ing time.

Checking trees for scale and 
borer damage is another job which 
shouldn’t be delayed. Scale infes­
tation at this time can kill trees 
unless treated promptly. If only 
a few trees are affected a mixture 
of two and one half tablespoons of 
lye to one gallon of water applied 
with an old paint brush will do 
the trick. In large orchards, win­
ter spraying with oil emulsion or 
concentrated lime sulphur will 
deal with scale.

Para-di-chloro benzene, com- 
monly called PDB is most effect­
ive against borers when used in 
middle October or up to mid- 
November.

FANCY ft STAPLE

THE BEST ASSORTMENT OF

Fresh Vegetables
THE MARKET AFFORDS

> IN OUR MARKET

THE VERY BEST, HIGH QUALITY

Baby Beef and Pork
ALL FRESH — HOME KILLED 

Large Selection of All Desirable Cuts.
PURE PORK SAUSAGE •  HOT BARBECUE

CLIFFORD & RAY
GROCERIES &  MEATS

COLD STORAGE LOCKER PLANT IN CONNECTION
5 Phone 6 

WE DELIVER

Auxiliary—
(Continued from Front Page) 

as well as the women who have 
themselves been enlisted, will 
give increased strength for a- 
chievement to the American Leg­
ion Auxiliary. Together the two 
organizations will be a mighty 
force for America, serving in 
every community in the land to 
“care for those who have borne 
the battle".

You are privileged to be part of 
this great force.

A membership in the American 
Legion Auxiliary awaits you. 
Take it. You will always value it 
among your dearest possessions. 
Dear Legionnaire:

Aubyr* E. Clark Unit No. 126 is 
offering to your mother, wife, sis­
ters and daughters membership in 
the greatest patriotic woman’s or­
ganization in the world. We are 
offering this membership to them 
because they have experienced 
the pangs of anxiety for loved 
ones, the sacrifices and hardships 
which war brings to the families 
of the fighting men; because those 
experiences have made them 
value highly the things for which 
our men have fought—are fight­
ing—America and all that it 
means; and because we know you 
desire them to continue to serve, 
in war and in the peace that is to 
come, with, our fighting men, for 
America.

The American Legion Auxil­
iary, in the year just passed, as­
sisted 493,999 children at a total 
cost of $2,364,484.67. Here in our 
own state of Texas 18,182 children 
were helped at a cost of $36,622.75.

We have aided 37,352 veterans 
and 102,819 veteran families at a 
cost of $315,608.61.

When the women of your family 
accept membership in the Ameri­
can Legion Auxiliary they become 
a part of those fine services to our 
friends and neighbors.

The Dues are $1.50 per year.
We hope you will join us in re­

questing the ladies of your family 
to accept membership in this, the 
greatest woman service organiza­
tion in the world—THE AMERI­
CAN LEGION AUXILIARY.

Mrs. C. Huffman 
Unit President 

Mrs. Karl Adams 
Unit Membership Chairman

Mrs. C. G. Stricklin, Mrs. C. A. 
Burton and Misses Charlotte 
Molesworth and Ruth Richerson 
attended the Red Cross meeting 
in Amarillo Friday.

DONLEY COUNTY LEADER.

Cotton Seed
,  i » *  ' * \

4 N A

We Buy C o tto n  Seed
PRICE $ 5 6 .0 0  p”

Will let you have 1000 lbs. Cotton Seed Meal 

or Cake for each ton of seed you sell us.

CLARENDON NATCHERY

Old Ag

“Sure, I remember how much land was worth in the last 
war, but I also remember how little it was worth and what 
happened afterwards. Inflation ruined a lot of frrmere 
then”

NEW ARRIVAL
Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Baten of 

Brice announce the arrival of a 
son, Monday, October 18, at a 
Memphis hospital. The name is 
Arnold Eugene. Mr. and Mrs. 
Baten operate the store just as you 
enter the Brice flat.

Mrs. Maude H. Church of Long 
Beach, Calif, is visiting her daugh­
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Carroll Knorpp.

Mrs. U. J. Boston, Mrs. C. A. 
Burton and Mrs. J. D. Stocking 
were in Hedley for the 50th' Wed­
ding Anniversary of Mr. and Mrs. 
T. R. Moreman Sunday.

(Continued from Front Page) 
necessary for this department to 
scrupulously follow the law and 
leave both extremes on the rolls 
as the law requires, the law gives 
Us the duty of defining the stand­
ard of need. It therefore is pos­
sible by policy to include or ex­
clude what might be termed semi­
essentials and to limit the stand­
ard of living which can be pro­
vided.

With this in mind we have just 
issued a new rule book for the 
three programs. Old Age Assist­
ance, Aid to the Blind, and Aid to 
Dependent Children, which covers 
65 pages, succeeding a manual 
that covered 377 pages. In the 
future, grants will be made on the 
basis of what is needed by an in­
dividual for the purchase of the 
essentials only. By eliminating 
from the budgets allowances for 
purchase of semi-essentials, we 
hope to get rid of the cut and the 
nearly half a million dollars per 
month now being taken from total 
grants by proration will be ab­
sorbed by taking the semi-essen­
tials out of budgets, limiting 
standards of living which assist­
ance money can provide, and re­
quiring fuller use of private re­
sources. In this way we hope to in­
sure the absolute necessities to 
those solely dependent upon Old 
Age Assistance.

__Thursday, October 21, IMS

Leader to Publish 
Broncho Range

Beginning this week the Leader 
will publish the Broncho Range 
each week, devoting as much 
space as possible. Due to the ur­
gent request of the government 
that we use as much of their ma­
terial as possible, we will be un­
able to allow the space to the 
schools that we would like.

The Broncho Range carries cur­
rent happenings of the three Clar­
endon schools—South Ward, Jun­
ior Hifli and the High School and 
Jr. College. The news is written 
each week by the students and 
censored by a competent teacher. 
We publish this news not only for 
the benefit of the students and 
school, but that the public may 
read about the activities of a 
wide-awake school, whose aim is 
to merit the confidence and hope 
that has been placed in them by 
their parents.

Mrs. W. L. McConnell of Perry- 
ton is visiting her mother, Mrs. 
J. D. Stocking.

Mrs. J. L. Allison and son Glen 
saw the parade at Amarillo Friday

Mrs. Gretta Kelley from Los 
Angeles, Calif, is visiting her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J. A. Howard.

Mr. and Mrs. Nolie Simmons 
and Mrs. Chas. Speed and Bettie 
Ann Speed visited Mrs. Ed Speed 
who is in the Northwest Texas 
Hospital for treatment.

Thad Rodgers of the NaVy is 
here visiting his father^ l3?ink 
Rodgers and other relative*

Doneta Chamberlain of Por- 
tales, N. Mex. visited Beverly 
Gray Stricklin Tuesday night.

Dr. Keith S. Lowell 
GENERAL PRACTICE 

AND SURGERY

Offices in Goldston Bldg. 
Office Phone 128 

Residence Phone 174
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IM - S Y S T E M
F o r  B E T T E R  Q U A L I T Y  and S A Y I N G S

If you need Canned Fruit, w e have plenty.

S P U D S
10 LBS.

3 5 c

ORANGES

DOZEN

2 8 c

/ / J* »
LETTUCE
Largo Firm Hoada 

EACH

9  c

CABBAGE
Fine for Kraut 

POUND

3 c
APPLES OCr PEANUT BUTTERQuart Jar .................. ......................55c 1
JUMBO CELERY 6(1 Stalk ........................ I9C GREEN BEANS 6 AWapco (8-Points)—No. 2 Can.......................  IOC j
GRAPES «Tokey—Pound ....................................  IwC PINTO BEANS ANo. I (2-Points)—Pound ...........................  9C 1
FINE CRANBERRIES AAQuart............................................  LvC CRACKERS 4A2 lb. Box .........................................  |9C

We Have 
White

C O R N
MEAL

M SYSTEM
F L O U R

Extra High Patent

48lb s . . . $1.98 
24 lbs. .$1.05

C O F F E E
RANCH STYLE

1 lb. Can ONLY

2 9 c

M A T C H E S
DIAMOND 

6 Largo Boxoa

2 9 c
W-P CLEANSERPackage............... . . ....... wC L A T 0 IA e e 0 ..............................  10c
BA BO CLEANER WHITE SWAN MILK A£3 Tall Cana.................................... A.0C
CLOROX BLEACH <flO~ WEINERS AF(S-Points)—Pound .................... ........  &vC
CAMAY TOILET SOAP 3 Bars 22c DRY SALT BACON AA(4-Points)—Pound .............................  /amC

RIVAL

Sliced Bacon
POUND

Pork Chops
Nice and Loan

POUND

Chuck Roast
POUND

2 6 c
• ■* (9-Points)

PURE

Pork Sausage
POUND

3 1 c
(6-Polnta)

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT THE AMOUNT OF ANY ITEMS. err

I


