
Hfctoricti Mm«um xx V /

IF a pencil mark appoars in 
this box. your subscription j 
has expired. Please let us 
have your renewal promptly.

i
| The LEADER brings your 
I friends and acquaintances 
I near you every week. Keep 
I your subscription paid up.

1878 A COUNTY - WIDE PUBLICATION, SERVING DONLEY COUNTY and ITS TRADE TERRITORY 1946
New Series—Volume 17 Number 42 CLARENDON. DONLEY COUNTY, TEXAS, DECEMBER 5, 1946 A Common Paper for Common People

College Science Teacher not available 
At Present Salary Schedule

All of the public junior • col­
lege’s in the state of Texas were 
recently contacted by H. T. Bur­
ton, president of Clarendon Jun­
ior College, in an effort to secure 
a teacher for the science depart­
ment of Clarendon Junior Col­
lege. Replies were received from 
fourteen of the other 17 junior 
colleges in the state. The salary 
schedule paid by the junior col­
leges in the other towns was also 
obtained. Presidents of the var­
ious colleges stated they knew of 
no available teachers at the sal­
aries offered by the local school 
system.

The local junior college pays 
its president $3300, its dean $3000. 
and its teachers $1521. Gainsville 
Junior College pays its president 
$3,800, its dean 
teachers $2,050.
College pays its president $6,000, 
its dean $4,000, and its teachers 
from $3,000 to $4,000. Corpus 
Christi Junior College pays its 
president $5,000, its dean $4850, 
and its teachers from $2550 to 
$3590. Lamar Junior College at 
Beaumont pays its president $8,- 
000. its dean $4,800, and its teach­
ers $3,000. Texarkana Junior Col­
lege pays its president $7992, its 
dean $5031, and its teachers 
$2700. Ranger Junior College 
pays its president $3680, its dean 
$3000, and its teachers $1890. 
Hillsboro Junior College pays its 
president $4700, its dean $3000, 
and its teachers $2400. San An­
tonio Junior College pays its 
president $6000, its dean $3600, 
and its teachers $3000. Browns­
ville pays its president $6,000. its 
dean $3800, and its teachers from 
$2 5 0 0  t o  $3000. L e e  J u n io r  Col­
lege at Goose Creek pays its 
president $7,000, its dean $4,020, 
and its teachers $2871. Temple 
Junior College pays its president 
$5600, its dean $4,000, and its 
teachers $2400. San Angelo Jun­
ior College pays its president 
$5600, its dean $4000, and its 
teachers $3,000 Edinburg Junior 
College pays its president $6,000. 
its dean $5368 and its teachers 
from $2724 to $3132.

The qualifications for instruc­
tors in Clarendon Junior College 
is the same as that for instructors 
in the colleges listed above, and 
the work in this school holds the 
same rank as that completed in 
any of the above mentioned 
schools.

SERVICES TODAY FOR 
MRS. J. S. MORGAN

Funeral services were held this 
afterm»on at 2 p. m. at the local 
Church of Christ for Mrs. John S. 
Morgan with W. T. Hines, minis­
ter, officiating.

Mrs. Morgan, age 79, passed 
away at the Adair hospital Wed­
nesday morning following a brief 
illness. She was a member of the 
Church of Christ and has been a 
resident of the County and Clar­
endon for the past 43 years.

She is suivived by her hus­
band, three sons, Otis Morgan and 
Otho Morgan of Wichita Falls 
and Ben Morgan of Odessa; two 
daughters, Mrs. Jonnie May 
Walls of El Paso and Mrs. Jessie 

$3,000, and its! Sn«'Ocl of Amarillo. Also one sis- 
Kilgore Junior Mis. J. R. Brown of Tisha- 

mingo, Oklu.. and sixteen grand­
children and six great grand 
children.

Pallbearers were S. T. Nichols, 
U. J. Boston, Sid Endsley, Guy 
Wright, C. A. Wright and Frank 
Thomas.

Burial was in Citizens Ceme­
tery with the Murphy-Spicer- 
Buntin Funeral Home in charge 
of arrangements.

College Veterans 
Support Tax Issue

One of the foremost issues at 
this time concerning the fifty- 
three Veterans of World War II, 
who are attending the local col­
lege and high school, is the school 
tax increase issue upon which the 
future of the public schools and 
Clarendon Junior College de­
pends.

The veterans group is sponsor­
ing a full page feature on this 
question in this issue of the 
Leader and may be found by 
turning to the first page of sec­
tion two. These veterans are 
highly concerned over this issue 
as they feel that the continuation 
of Clarendon Junior College 
means that they will have the 
opportunity of being able to con­
tinue their college education at 
this time.

According to the spokesman of 
the group, every business man 
and public official in Clarendon 
was contacted and asked for their 
support of the tax issue and of 
the Clarendon Public schools and 
Junior College, and that over 90 
percent of those contacted plcdg-
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Dismissed from the Clarendon 

Clinical Hospital this week were: 
Caroll Robertson, Merrelane 

Waddell, F. M. Lynn, J. C. Per­
due, C. L. McCrary, Mrs. Olan 
Sloan. Mrs. Myrtle Ayers, Mar­
shall, Texas (formerly Mrs. Myr- 
le Smith, McLean, Texas), Miss 
Wanda Nell Bagwell.

Patients in the Hospital 
time include:

D. A Halverson, Mrs.
Mayo. Mrs. J. W. Goodman, Mrs. 
T. H Harris, Billings, Montana,, 
Miss Eleanor Haines, Shamrock, 
Texas, Mrs. John S. Morgan, Mr. 
James Yarbrough.

(Last weeks notes) 
DISMISSALS:

Mrs. Opal Johnson, Mrs 
Stephens, Amarillo, Mrs, 
Hatfield, Mrs. W. T. Roberts, Mi’s. 
S. P. Pierce. Raymond McKee, 
Mrs. Richard Cannon, Mrs. W. L. 
Ayers, Marshall, Texas, Jack 
Semrad, Fred Smith, Mr. V. M. 
Montgomery. Mr. Jack Moore, 
Mr. Charlie Dozier. Mrs. W. C. 
McGchce, Wayside, Texas, Mrs.

it this

J. T.

G. D. 
Mark

Meeting Held 
On Irrigation

A meeting on irrigation in 
Donley County was held in the 
office of county agent H. M. 
Breedlove on Tuesday night, 
Nov. 26th. Fifteen business men 
and farmers were present to dis­
cuss this phase of agriculture in 
the county.

Breedlove gave a discussion of 
surveys made in the county on 
irrigation and possibilities for ir­
rigation. Mr. Ray Noblitt, chair­
man of the promotion of irriga­
tion outlined the plan of the 
committee to assist in starting 
irrigation and the entire commit­
tee pledged themselves to assist 
in every way possible to assist 
this program.

Mr. Noblitt, H. M. Breedlove, 
Carrol Knorpp and Lon Rundell 
will go to Plainview on Tuesday 
to consult supply companies on 
irrigation pumps and necessary 
pipe for the well.

Information is now being gath­
ered for a meeting to be held on 
Thursday night, Dec. 5th at seven 
thirty in the office of the county 
agent. Everyone is invited to this 
meeting. It will start promptly at 
seven thirty, so be on time if you 
are interested in irrigation.

Rev. and Mrs. H. W. Hanks 
went to Colorado Cit> to eat 
Thanksgiving dinner with her 
mother. They were met there by 
their son and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wyatt Hanks from Leveland and 
daughter Mary Nell from Fort 
Worth.

Southwest markets saw 
proved holiday demand up 
prices of livestock, eggs, cotton 
and sweet potatoes to offset the 
lower tendency taken by most 
grains, turkeys and some vege 
tables lust week, USDA’s Produc 
tion and Marketing Administra­
tion reports.

Thanksgiving found plenty of 
turkeys at southwest markets 
but demand slow and prices 
weak. Young toms brought most­
ly 23 to 25 cents per pound and 
young hens 34 to 37 cents. De­
mand for chickens was brisk. 
Heavy hens held steady at 22 to 
25 cents per pound and fryers at 
37 to 40 cents.

Egg prices strengthened as 
fresh supplies were small to meet 
the increased holiday demand 
last week. Current receipts rang­
ed from 45 to 50 cents per dozen, 
depending on market locale.

Light cattle receipts accounted 
for the active trading at most 
southwest markets last week. 
Prices were steady to stronger 
under the pressure of improved 
demand. Small offerings of med­
ium and good slaughter steers 
brought $17.50 to $21 per hund­
red at Wichita and $18.75 to 
$24.50 at Denver. Medium and 
good steers and yearlings ranged 
from $15 to $18.50 at Oklahoma 
City. Good slaughter steers and 
yearlings realized $20 to $25 at 
Fort Worth while cutter and 
common lightweight yearlings 
and steers brought $9.50 to $11 
at San Antonio. Houston sold 
common and medium steers and 
yearlings $11 to $15.

Keen competition for small hog 
receipts carried prices higher at 
most markets last week. Top 
price for good and choice butch­
ers was $25 to $25.25 per hund­
red opunds at Fort Worth, Okla­
homa City and Denver, $25.75 at 
Wichita, and $25 at San Antonio.

Grain markets were unsettled 
at the week’s close due to the un­
certainty of the effect the coal 
strike will have on transportation 
and industry. Wheat held about 
steady, sorghums lost sharply and 
oats, barley and corn slipped 
some after the holiday.

Spot cotton prices advanced 
about $5 per bale last week as de­
mand from all sources improved 
Southwest offerings, though 
small, were larger than the week 
before, and insufficient to meet 
the deri!and.

cd to support the tax issue that Ernest Houdashcll, Hodley, Tcx- 
mcans so much to those students.
He added further that only a 
small number of firms and indi­
viduals contacted refused to 
pledge their support to this very 
important issue and thus voiced 
their indifference as to whether 
or not Clarendon has a properly 
accredited high school and Junior 
College.

The veterans group is at a loss 
to understand how any business 
firm, individual, or public official 
would desire to see inferior 
schools come to Clarendon, but
such is the definite expression
of a number of those refusing 
to pledge support to the schools, 
the spokesman added.

Turn to their advertisement 
and read the contents for more 
details concerning the Veterans 
view points.

as.
MEDICAL PATIENTS:

Wanda Nell Bagwell, Carroll 
Robertson, Mrs. J W Goodman, 
Merrelane Waddell.
SURGICAL PATIENTS:

Leonard Vaughn. Hedlcy, Tex­
as, Mrs. M. J. Gibson, Mrs. Travis 
Harris. Billings, Montana.
NEW ARRIVALS:

A daughter Cotrina Lee to Mr. 
and Mrs. W. M.. Snelson, Hedlcy, 
Texas.

(Unless otherwise stated all 
I addrosses arc Clarendon)

CLARENDON GIRL ELECTED 
PRESIDENT OF CLUB

GLOBAL MEDICAL 
INSTITUTE

Now scattered, the Regular 
Army’s laboratories are to be 
placed in a new "Global Medical has been an active

Fannie McGowan, a graduate 
of Clarendon Public Schools and 
former member of the local 
school faculty, has resided in 
Prescott, Arizona since last Janu­
ary. Immediately upon her ar­
rival there she became the as­
sistant bookkeeper to the Arizona 
Mining Supply Corp. Lumber Co.

Since February, Mis? McGowan 
member of

Institute” — the Army Medical 
Research and Graduate Training 
Center, to be built just outside of 
Washington. It will be one of the 
greatest in the world and will 
have facilities to conduct research 
on all diseases on a global scale.

For further information about 
enlisting in the New Regular 
Army Medical Corps, contact 
M/Sgt. G. W. Parrot at Legion 
Hall, Clarendon, Texas.

COAL STRIKE HANDICAPS 
PACKAGE M AILING

Due to conservation of train 
space, packages must not weigh 
over five pounds that are to be 
sent by mail after midnight this 
Thursday night. The former 
weight limit is seventy pounds.

This will be a serious handi­
cap to Christmas mailing, post­
master J. C. Estlack announces, 
but is unavoidable on the part of 
the Postal Department due to the 
coal strike still in progress.

Mr. and Mrs. William Green, 
son Billie Mack and daughter 
Ann Carolyn, of Trinidad, Texas, 
were at home with his father and 
mother, Mr. and Mrs. G. L. Green 
for Thanksgiving, also Mr. and 
Mrs. A. L. Lanier of Waxahachie 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. G. L. 
Green over the week.

Local Youths Promoted
Two youths from Clarendon 

were rewarded for proficiency in 
military subjects at Wentworth 
Military Academy, Lexington, 
Mo., this year when they were 
advanced in rank with the publi­
cation of a special order by Lt. 
Col. William McKee, the Acad­
emy’s professor of military 
science and tactics^

The local youths who were pro­
moted are: Cadet J. Carroll 
Brumley, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
R. S. Brumley, promoted to Cadet 
Staff Sergeant and Cadet Carl 
Bennett, son of Mr. and Mrs. C. 
W. Bennett, promoted to Cadet 
Sergeant.

the Business and Professional 
Womens Club of Prescott. Re­
cently she has been elected to the 
presidency of Prescott Interna­
tional Toastmistrcss Club.

Within three weeks, Fannie 
shall arrive home via plane to 
spent the Christmas holidays 
with her father. Bob McGowan.

AAA Committee 
Elections

Elections of Community Com­
mitteemen and Delegates to the 
County Convention were held in 
each of the 8 communities in the 
county on Friday and Saturday of 
last week.

The Delegates will meet in the 
county office on Saturday, De­
cember 7 at 2:30 p. in. to elect 
the County Committeemen to 
serve for 1947. The eight Dele­
gates to the County Convention 
are: J. Sam Dale, Community A: 
Hugh S. Mahaffey, Community 
B; Gilbert Mann, Community C; 
Glen Williams, Community D; 
Oscar Anderson. Community E; 
William H. Clay, Community F; 
George E. Kinslow, Community 
G; and John C. Bible, Commun­
ity H. Three Committeemen will 
be elected on Saturday, one from 
each of the three divisions in the 
county, centered around Claren­
don, Lelia Lake and Hedley.

The Committeemen elected to 
serve from each of the eight com­
munities were: Community A: 
Roy H. Stewart, Ernest L. Lamb 
and Hoy D. Brock, the alternates 
for Community A are Houston D 
McDonald and Arthur P. Brown.

Community B: Pink M. Mar­
shall. Richard Cannon and Roy 
Brinson. The Alternates are Wil­
lie D. Brandon and George E. 
Bulman.

Community C: Melvin C. Ram- 
py, Edwin Baley and Forrest E. 
Sawyer. The alternates are Alfred
B. Ivt y .mil Kirk R Du.-.hier.

Community D: Dennis F. Reed,
William J. Williams and Edd W. 
Mooring. The alternates are Pete 
Riley and Richard Dingier.

Community E: James B. Smith, 
Carroll L. Li-u-w and Oscar An­
derson. The alternates nrr Harvey
C. Shaw and Benjamin F. Wol­
ford.

Community F. Tommy W. 
Bain, Frank D. Davis and Lea­
rn on D. Messer. The alternates 
are Civil P. Merriman and Frank 
Jones.

Community G: Jay K. Hunt. 
Charlie A. Crow and Enos M. 
Glass. The alternates are Robert 
L. Lester and Raymond T. Ever­
ett.

Community H: Thomas C. D’- 
Spain, Louis A. Kalka and W. O. 
Hommcl. The alternates are J. L. 
Shields and W. O. Simmons.

Clarendon Group to Meet With CAA 
Officials At Fort Worth Today
UNMAILABLE MATTER 
ITEMS ARE MANY

Packages containing many art­
icles are not mailable under the 
Postal Regulations. A few of 
them include intoxicating bever­
ages, inflammable matter such as 
matches, lighter fluid and other 
articles likely to cause fire 
through absorption of moisture, 
or by friction.

Others include ammunition of 
all kinds or other explosives, fire­
arms that may be concealed on 
the person, poisons, narcotics, 
extortion or lottery letters, and 
chain letters of a type come with­
in this category.

Cards that carry obscene pic­
tures or wording that is obscene 
are unmailable under the postal 
law.

Matter that is unmailable will 
be excluded by the mail clerks 
and handled in the legal manner 
prescribed Gy the Postal Depart­
ment.

The postal laws provide severe 
penalties for the mailing of many 
of the above named articles, post­
master J. C. Estlack stated today.

A group o f Clarendon men and 
representatives of a number of 
surrounding towns are meeting 
with L. C. Elliott, Regional Ad­
ministrator of the Civil Aero­
nautics Administration in Fort 
Worth today with regard to the 
communications station at the 
local airport. Recently Elliott is- 
ued an order to close the local 
station on December 17th. The 

! radio and weather facilities are 
used by fliers on all regularly 
scheduled airlines and by hund­
reds of private fliers in this reg­
ion. Six employees of the station 
live in Clarendon.

The Clarendon group and the 
representatives from the other 
surrounding towns will attempt 
to prove the importance of the 
local station compared to other 
similar stations in the Southern 
Region. Mayor C. B. Morris, City 
Commissioner Pete Kunz. Lee 
Bell. R. E. Drennan, Joe Jones, 
L. L. Wallace, Carl Allmond, Dr. 
K. S. Lowell, and J. R. Gillbam 
are Clarendon representatives in 
the group.

FORMER RESIDENT BURIED 
AT TUCUMCARI, N. M.

Funeral services were held at 
the Dunn Funeral Chapel at 
Tucuincari, N. M. November 25th 
for Mrs. Rose Jane Morgan with 
Rev. Paul Baughcr, Logan, N. M. 
officiating.

Mrs. Morgan passed away at 
her home at Logan Nov. 23rd. 
She had lived in Donley county a 
long number of years before 
moving to I,ognn. N . M. seven 
years ago.

Survivors here include a 
brother-in-law, Jim Morgan, a 
niece Mrs. Bill Moore and a 
nephew. Bill Richards.

Pallbearers were Tom Morgan.
1 Frank Morgan. Donald Morgan,
' Dan Morgan, Claude Morgan and 
I Dennis Hibbs.

Burial was in the Tucumcari 
Memorial Park.

UTILITIES COMPANY  
BUILDING LINE  
TO PAMPA

Allen Shahan, district manager 
of the West Texas Utilities com­
pany with headquarters at Child­
ress, has been here much of the 
week looking after the construc­
tion of the new line being con­
structed from here to Pampa.

With the added load of REA 
lines, the local plant cannot carry 
the load properly at times. As a 
safeguard, the Utilities company 
will get power off the South­
western line at Pampa when 
needed.

This arrangement insures all 
patrons of the Utilities lines be­
tween here and Childress plenty 
of current at all times.

Mr. and Mrs. W. O. Butler had 
for Thanksgiving holidays visit, 
their children, Mr. and Mrs. Mar­
shall Butler of Los Angeles. Cali., 
Mrs. Katie Zackery, Mr. and Mrs. 
E. A. Hardin and Mr. and Mrs. 
Gene Butler from Pampa.

FIRST GRANDSON
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Frey are 

the proud parents of a baby son 
who arrived Nov. 21, 1946 and 
weighs 7 lbs., 1 oz. He has been 
named John Lesley for his two 
grandfathers, John W. Frey of 
Gainesville, Texas and F. L. 
Goldston of Clarendon. Mrs. 
Frey is better known here as 
Margaret Goldston.

ATTEND FAMILY 
REUNION

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Chunn at­
tended a family reunion of the 
Chunn family at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. L. B. Chunn at Plain- 
view Thanksgiving day. All of 
the brothel’s and one sister were 
present except F. L. Chunn of 
Dallas.

Those present were Mr. and 
Mrs. Dick Chunn of Clarendon, 
Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Chunn and 
children of Plainview, Rev. M. M. 
Chunn of Houston, Mr. and Mrs. 
C. B. Chunn of Carlsbad, Mr. and 
Mrs. S. J. Chunn of Amarillo, and 
Mrs. J. M. Perdue of Abilene.

Guests visiting in the Carl Nay­
lor home over the Thanksgiving 
holidays were Mr. and Mrs. Cal­
vin Naylor of Wichita Falls, Mr. 
and Mrs. G. B. Kettle and Myra 
Jane of Wichita Falls, Rev. J. R. 
and Mrs. Naylor, Rhudy and 
Janice of Thrift, Mrs. Roberta 
Wood, Lavada, Sara and Jon 
Naylor of Pampa, Mr. and Mrs. 
Melvin Vick of Clarendon.

ROB HAMPTON OPENS 
DRIVE-IN GROCERY

Rob Hampton is announcing in 
the Leader this week, the open­
ing of his new drive-in Grocery 
today. The new business is locat­
ed on east first street seven 
blocks from main street.

Since returning from the ser­
vice, Mr. Hampton has been en­
gaged in building his own home 
and business building on the 
same lot. He was formerly en­
gaged in the salvage business be­
fore entering the service in 
April, 1945.

PIONEER CLARENDON 
RESIDENT BURIED 
IN MISSOURI

Funeral services were held in 
Waverly, Missoni i Saturday, Nov. 
30th for Mrs. Minnie Elizabeth 
Dyer, who passed away at her 
home here in Clarendon Novem­
ber 27th.

Mrs. Dyer, age 80 years, came 
to the Panhandle in 1909. She was 
a member of the Methodist 
church here and a very faithful 
worker with that denomination.

Surviving Mrs. Dyer is one son, 
Sam Dyer of Clarendon; one 
grand daughter, Miss Maxine 
Ellis of Clarendon and one broth­
er, Palmer Brown, Waverly. Mo.

Mrs. Dyer’s body was taken 
overland by the Murphy-Spicer- 
Buntin Funeral Home for burial 
in the cemetery at Waverly, Mo.

RELATIVES AND FRIENDS 
GATHER IN THE HOME 
OF W. M. McBRAYER

Relatives and friends gathered 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. W. 
M. McBrayer of Hedley, Sunday, 
November 24. to celebrate their 
40th wedding anniversary as well 
as Mrs. McBrayer’s birthday.

Those present were Mr. and 
Mrs. O. L. McBrayer and family 
and Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Rattan 
of Clarendon; Mr. and Mrs. Elvitv 
Phillips and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Smith. Mr. and Mrs. Orvf! 
Hill and family of Lelia Lake; 
Mr. and Mi’s. J. C. McBrayer and 
son of Dumas; Mr. and Mrs. Car- 
roll Jones of Amarillo; Mr. Julus 
Gregory of Memphis. All attend­
ed the Union Thanksgiving Ser­
vice at the First Baptist Church 
at H**iley.

Dinner was served buffet style. 
After dinner, gifts were displayed 
and singing was enjoyed by all.

Those to call in the afternoon 
were Rev. Earnest Phillips and 
wife, pastor of the First Baptist 
Church. Lelia Lake.

COTTON GINNING 
REPORT

According to Special Agent, 
W. M. Patman, the Census report 
shows that 3.697 bales of cotton 
were ginned in Donley County 
from the crop of 1946 prior to 
Nov. 14th as compared with 6.224 
bales for the crop of 1945.

LOCAL BOY MEMBER OF 
CHAMPION BALL CLUB 
IN  MISSOURI

The Wentworth Military Acad­
emy at Lexington, Mo. won the 
honor of being the top Jr. College 
team in Missouri and one of the 
players who displayed a very 
good brand of football in a back- 
field position was Buddy Brum­
ley, son of Mr. and Mrs. Rolle 
Brumley of this city.

RT. REV. QUARTERMAN 
CONSECRATED BISHOP 
OF NORTH TEXAS

In an age-old and colorful 
ceremony, conducted according 
to the Rite of the Protestant 
Episcopal Church in the United 
States of America, the Rt. Rev. 
George Henry Quarterman was 
consecrated Bishop of the Miss­
ionary District of North Texas on 
December 3rd in St. Andrew’s 
Church, Amarillo.

He was elected to this high of­
fice by the House of Bishops at 
the General Convention last Sep­
tember, and canonical consent 
for his Consecration was given at 
that time by the House of Cleri­
cal and Lay Deputies. At the 
time of his election, the now 
Bishop was rector of St. Andrew’s 
Parish, Amarillo. From 1931 to 
February of the present year he 
had served with distinction as 
rector of St. Philip’s Parish, Ard­
more, Okla.

Mrs. Lena Antrobus returned 
from Okla. City where she visited 
her daughter Mrs. Tren Stargel.

Local Boxers To 
Participate In> 
Meet At Amarillo

Bill Bentley, local boxing 
coach, has entered several of his 
boys in the Maverick Club Invi­
tational tourney which is to be 
held this Friday and Saturday 
nights at the Fair Grounds arena 
in Amarillo.

Those entered in the tourna­
ment from here are Kenneth 
Davis, title holder of the Golden 
Gloves held last year; Troy Wiley 
bantam weight contender who is 
expected to display plenty of 
style and offer plenty of opposi­
tion for his opponent; Jerry Mor­
gan, a spunky 95-pounder will be 
in there scrapping to show the 
fans his ability. A new comer in 
the local boxing team who will 
be out for his first bout is Charlie 
Johnson, 165-pounder, who has 
been bearing down on his train­
ing routine for quite some time. 
Since he hasn’t fought in any 
meets, we don’t know just how 
he will get along but his oppon­
ent had better be good with the 
gloves.

It is understood that there will 
be plenty of class packed in 
every division of the two-night 
show and a large number of fans 
are already making their plans to 
attend from here.

OK
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There are times, aren't there, when you wish you 

didn’t love him so much? Times like .this when 

you want to get him just THE present to bring out 

that wonderful happy grin and you’re scared stiff 

you won’t find it. You w ill find it though— be­

cause it's Christmas at —
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It is said to be possible to bleed 
to death without suffering any 
pain. Just thought this might be 
some comfort to the taxpayers.

Hawaii is strongly Republican, 
and should it become a state it 
would add two senators to that 
side, by the same token Alaska is 
Democrat by tradition. It is said 
that each party is watching to 
see that the other doesn't slip in

any adopted children on them. 
However, I can’t believe our 
statesmen would be unstatesman 
about something like this.

Just heard about an eighty- 
year-old lady that had quilted 
fifty odd quilts so far this year, 
and had promised to make 16 
more for one family, if her health 
held out, and I bet it docs. How 
wonderful it must be to be that 
active at that age and to still be 
doing such important work in 
the world. What courage, and 
grit, and stickability she must 
have. I guess the main reason 
are so many wonderful people in 
West Texas is the fact that we 
have had so many wonderful 
grandmothers out here. I kinda 
believe this.

Another old saying: “A whist­
ling woman and a crowing hen, 
always come to some bad end.

m f m

IT S A BAD POLICY NOT 
TO HAVE A  GOOD ONE

It is safo—but is it suffic- 
iont? Insurance should bo 
adoquato, both to onot 
moans and noods. Sufficient 
insurance is an aconomical 
necessity.

JACK McCLURE

Republic National Life Ins. Co.
Dallas, Taxas

Jack J. McClure, Special Representative
Clarendon, Texas Phono 198

Send in your grandmothers fav­
orite saying.

Lucky we arc in Texas that we 
don’t depend very much on coal 
for heat during this strike. We 
have some wood, lots of gas, and 
if the worst comes to the worst 
there is that old fashioned "cow- 
chip.” I remember burning them 
during the other war, and if I re­
member right, Mama’s biscuits 
tasted plenty good, or was it sup­
posed to make any difference?

Supt. L. A. Woods in address­
ing the Teachers convention ad­
vocated school twelve months in 
the year. First hand, just don’t 
seem like it would be a good idea 
to me. I always got a lot of pleas­
ure looking forward to school be­
ing out. Anyway if I had been 
there I would rather have heard 
him explain why Texas ranks 
thirty-third in education, instead 
of about fifth or sixth. Looks 
like we ought to move up in line 
with the other boys our size, be­
fore we try to out jump them.

Congressman Gene Worley 
tells this story: A southern Sen­
ator was running for re-election, 
and he heard about a man up­
state, that was working for his 
opponent who was supposed to 
be working for him. So he went 
up to see him about it. ‘ ‘Didn’t I 
keep you from losing your home 
two years ago,” said the senator, 
"and didn’t I get your son out of 
‘ rouble last year.” "Yeah,” said 
the voter, “but you haven’t done 
anything for me lately.” I kinda 
thought politics was like that - - 
the reason I stuck with farming.

Farmers are supposed to have 
two dollars and fifty cents, or its 
equivalent for every one dollar 
they owe now. In 1939 they owed 
two dollars for each one dollar or 
its equivalent that they owne'd.

Too many people get into pub­
lic office by making a lot of 
promises, and try to stay in by 
trying to keep off of everybody’s 
toes.

♦ LELIA LAK E ♦
♦ ♦
♦ Mrs. H. R. King ♦
+ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

Jack Fowlkes, a student of 
Wayland College at Plainview, 
arrived Wednesday to spend the 
holidays with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Fowlkes.

L. D. Aten returned last Tues­
day from an extended visit with 
relatives at Cutler, and other 
points in Indiana.

Beth Davis of Lockney arrived 
Wednesday to spend Thanksgiv­
ing with her parents, Supt. and 
Mrs. O. L. Davis.

Miss Edna Wood of Dumas 
spent the holidays here with rel­
atives.

Mr. and Mrs. R. A. Nall of 
Amarillo spent Thanksgiving
day with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. H. Wood and her daugh­
ter, Doris Robertson.

Mr. and Mrs. Willard Knox 
visited relatives at Comanche 
last week.

'  Mr. and Mrs. Olcn Usrcy and 
Katherine and Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Bannister of Clarendon left 
Wednesday to spend the holidays 
with Mr. and Mrs. Wallace Riffle 
of Arkansas.

Johnny Leathers, who is at­
tending school at Lubbock Tech 
spent Thanksgiving with his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. D. E. Leathers.

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Mace of 
Farwell spent the weekend with 
relatives here.

Mr. and Mrs. Adell Williams of 
Borger spent the weekend with 
friends here.

Mr. and Mrs. N. R. Simmons 
pnd Jack and Will Mace spent 
Thanksgiving in Farwell with 
Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Mace.

Miss Mary Roberts of Amarillo 
Ipent the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Luther Butler.

Mr. and Mrs. C. L. Lewis and 
Mrs. J. L. Butler had business in 
Amarillo Friday.

Mrs. Moody Hamil and Miss 
Moody Aten spent Thanksgiving 
in Erick, Okla. with friends.

Mrs. J. T. Warren of Amarillo 
visited Mrs. Lola Bams Sunday.

Relief M Last* 
ForYourCough
Creomulslon relieves promptij be-

i expel
____  nature

soothe and heal'raw, tender, in- 
~ bronchial muooua m em - 

TeUyour druggist to seU you

trouble

, allays the cough or you ars to bant your money back.
CREOMULSION
forCnufoClMSt Colds, Bronchitis

In Stock
•  HOME RADIOS - Electric & Battery

•  CAR RADIOS

•  RADIO-PHONO Combination

•  RADIO BATTERIES

•  CAR ANTENNAS

•  TUBES and PARTS

Complete Service on all Makes 
Home and Car Radios

ALL SERVICE A PARTS GUARANTEED 90 DAYS

FOR FREE PICK-UP Be DELIVERY  

SERVICE . . . . . . .  PHONE 119

CLACK RADIO SERVICE
YOUR MOTOROLA DEALER

AMARILLO CLARENDON

Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Butler and 
family spent Thanksgiving in 
Memphis with Mr. and Mrs. 
Andrew Womack.

Mrs. Greer Cottingham and 
Lon of Tucumcari, N. M. and Mrs. 
Laura Mae Noble and daughter of 
Dalhart spent the holidays with 
Mr. and Mrs. John Gemcr.

Mrs. Odell Mantooth and Miss 
Cleota Pope of McLean visited 
their father, J. D. Pope.

Mr. and Mrs. R. A. Phillips 
and son of Pampa left Friday af­
ter a visit with his parents, Rev. 
and Mrs. Ernest Phillips.

Mr. and Mrs. Elvin Phillips and 
family spent Thanksgiving in 
Amarillo.,

Mr. and Mrs. John McCauley 
of Amarillo spent the weekend 
here with their parents.

Mr. Jones of Kansas is visiting

in the home of his daughter, Mra 
Loy Bynum and family.

L. C. Williams of Clifton, Ariz. 
arrived Friday for an indefinite 
visit with his father, Z. N. Will­
iams.

Sam King spent the weekend 
with homefolks enroute from Los 
Angeles to Vernon where he 
purchased a new car.

CURSE O F  M ID D L E  L IF E

Faulty kidney function. Trouble 
starts by the ph. of the body fluida 
getting out of balance. Chemists 
find that if the ph. is corrected, bal- 
ance restores—the body repairs the 
damage, removes the pain. -CIT- 
ROS is the answer. Supplied by 
your druggist. For sale by

Douglas k  Goldston Drug Co.

NEVER, BUY REAL ESTATE 

WITHOUT A N  ABSTRACT.

Donley County Abstract Company
C. E. KILLOUGH

Phone 44

Announcing
THE OPENING OF

ROB’S DRIVE IN GROCERY

Thors., December 4,1946

I W A N T  TO INVITE A L L  M Y FRIENDS AND  

NEIGHBORS TO COME BY AND LOOK OVER  

M Y COMPLETE STOCK.
I

Located on Highway 287 

7 blocks East of Main Stroot.

Rob Hampton, Owner

MOW AVAIIA8
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♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦  
♦  ♦
♦ THE TEMPLE OF TRUTH ♦
♦ • ♦
4 By the Ar^etle ♦
♦ ♦

PERSONAL.
Ima Fizzle says that of all the 

selfish animals that she has met, 
met take the cake. “Man thinks 
only of himself when his wife 
dies,” she says, and proves her 
statement by his expression of 
“ how can I do without her,” 
which is his principal comment. 

♦ ♦ ♦ 
HISTORICAL.

Samson is said to be the first 
man to be trimmed by a woman, 
when Delilah cut his hair. Has- 
toon Yazzie announces that the 
custom still is going on.

♦ ♦  ♦
PIONEER STUFF.

In the old days when the old

man bought the family flour sup­
ply in a barrel, he could always 
tell when it was time to get 
another barrel by finding splin­
ters in the biscuits.

♦  ♦  ♦

POLITICAL.
It was none other than Grover 

Cleveland who stated that: 
“Some men grow when elected to 
office, others merely swell.”

♦  ♦  ♦
DEFINED.

“wolf” is said to ben an animal 
who picks up your chick instead 
of your check.

♦ ♦ 4
RADIO PESTS.

Paper is used in a radio broad­
cast to imitate storms and light­
ning crackling. However, that 
creaking sound you sometimes 
hear as if some one had opened a 
rusty bam door that needs a 
dash of oil, is merely an indica­

tion of the age of the jokes being 
used.

OLD HUMANITY.
A man is measured by the size 

of the thing that it takes to get 
his goat.

♦  ♦  ♦

BIOLOGICAL.
The Stork is smarter than the 

Owl. The Owl asks: “Who, who?” 
The Stork knows who.

A Feed for Every Need

A  full line of that good Chic-O-Line mixed feeds; 

also home grown and home mixed, ground and 

whole grain.

Grinding and Mixing is our every day business. 

W e also buy grain. See us for top prices.

Simpson’s Mill & Feed Store
Phone 149

♦ ♦
♦ IN DONLEY COUNTY ♦
♦ 26 Years Ago ♦
♦ ♦

Mrs. Joe McMutfry and Miss. 
Elizabeth Morris spent Sunday 
on the Morris ranch following a 
pack of hounds and shooting 
quail.

J. E. RuSsell, local insurance 
man and secretary of the school 
board, has been over in New 
Mexico where he says farmers 
are selling their cream at 71 
cents a pound around Roy and 
Mora.

Rev. Sam J. White arrived this 
week to assume the pastorate of 
the First Christian Church. Rev.

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER,

White has been state evangelist 
of Florid for 8 years.

Joe Cannon, who won first 
prize in the local fair exhibit on 
broom corn and squaw corn, 
makes a factory of his farming 
operations. His frequent trips to 
town with cream, butter, eggs 
and home cured meats find a 
ready market at top price be­
cause Joe's folks know just how 
to prepare home grown foods for 
market.

Sheriff J. H. Rutherford and 
T. M. Little and son Floyd re­
turned home Tuesday night from 
the south plains having in charge 
one Albert Newman who will be 
charged with the burglary of the 
T. M. Little store here two weeks 
ago. Newman and Arthur Talley 
are now in jail at Floydada where 
Rutherford says each of the men 
admitted the crime here.

•Ed Stanton was given seven 
years in Amarillo on a charge of 
having stolen a Dodge car recent­
ly from Cleveland Hayter.

E. E. Owens Jr. and Joe Keatty 
are in jail at Amarillo charged 
with the robbery of the Alanretd 
bank last week when $2640 is 
said to have been taken.

Joe Holland was elected post

PAGE THREE

commander of the local Legion 
post last week. Chas. Baldwin is 
vice; Curtis E. Thompson, Adj.; 
Walter Clifford. Treas.; W. H. 
Foster, chaplain; Harry Warren, 
historian. Byron Blevins is in 
charge of organizing a Ladies 
Auxiliary.
♦ ♦ + ♦ ♦ + ♦ + + + ♦ « ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦  
♦ ♦

A S H T O L A
Mrs. Keith Swinburne

INSURANCE OF ALL K INDS—  .

ABSTRACTS OF TITLE

REAL ESTATE NOTARY PUBLIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO.
C. C. POWELL

Phone II Clarendon

♦ + + ♦ + ♦ ♦ + ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦
Mr. and Mrs. Doyce Graham 

and sons spent Thanksgiving 
with her parents at Hudgins.

Mr. and Mrs. Goble Barker and 
afmily spent Sunday in the W. F. 
Barker home at Martin.

Mr. and Mrs. Rande Ray and 
Donnie ate Thanksgiving dinner 
Sunday at the J.A. headquarters.

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Marshall Jr. 
of Clarendon, Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Smith and Carrol of Clarendon, 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Marshall and 
family of Amarillo and Mr. and 
Mrs. Finis Marshall of Amarillo 
visited Sunday in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Pink Marshall.

Mr. E. H. Vanever and Mr. Zeb 
Burnett of Tulia spent the week 
end with Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Guy 
and family.

Mr. and Mrs. D. N. Little of 
San Angelo spent the holidays at 
the home of his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Thomas Swint.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Blalock 
and family spent the holidays at 
the J. W. Say home in Memphis. 
Arthur Dean Jewett returned 
with them for a visit. The Bla­
locks visited A. Freize at Lelia 
Lake Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. H. N. Henderson 
and Glyndol shopped in Memphis 
Friday.

Allen Wisenant and family of

PEACHES—Halves W
Del Monte. No. 10 else— O n ly .......................

$ 1 0 9 SPINACH
Hearts Delaiht. fancy California— No. 2 1 7 c

ASPARAGUS •
Fancy cut. all green spears— No. 2 ............... 4 1 c TOMATO JUICE

Marshall's, 46 os.— 4 Cans
$ 1 0 0

BEANS
Deer Brand, green cut— No. 2 e ls e ............. 1 3 c APPLE SAUCE

Sugar added (Hart brand)— No. 2 size 2 3 c

CHILLI
Ellis with beans— No. 2 s ix # ........................... 2 7 c MILK 3 1 cWhite Swan— 5 small cans .................

Ranch style BEANS
2 Cans for

2 5 c SARDINES
In Tomato Sauce— 2 tall cans 4 3 c

Quality Meats
Try Our Baby Grain Fad Baal 

It's Diffarant

KRAFT CHEESE B Q
SPREAD-^Olaaa .............

PORK CHOPS C ( L
1 Pound .............................. V w V

SIR LOIN STEAK C O
1 Pound ............................ V U C

Coffee
FIRESIDE
Blended of especially 

Selected Fine Coffees

our
1 Pound

EVERLIGHT 

Satisfaction Guaranteed 

50 lbs............................... $3.25
*

SPECIALS IN OUR

DRY GOODS DEPARTMENT
Just received shipment Miltex D resses.. $5.90

HAMBURGER
Pure Meat— 1 pound 35c Printed Slub material, all colors. • • • • • • • a 79c

PURE M X  LARD  A O
2 Pound* ........... . E rO C

FRANKS J 7
1 Pound ............................ “ ■ V

BOLOGNA a y
1 Pound ............................

Lunch Cloth, size 54x54 to 62x100

Ladies Sheer Dickies . . . o e o o o o e e a e e e $1.79 up
Cotton Print D resses........................ $2.90 up

FARMERS EXCHANGE
Phone 63-J GROCERY &  M A R K ET ' W e Deliver

JONATHAN

APPLES

8 c
POUND

Sweet Potatoes
POUND

8 c
Yellow Onions

POUND

5 c

Amarillo visited in the H. N. Hen­
derson home Saturday.

Herman Morrison of Claude 
and Frankie Harris of Clarendon 
spent Sunday with Glyndol Hen­
derson.

Mrs. Warren and Mr«v Farris of 
Clarendon visited with Mrs. Hen­
derson Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. R. B. Anderson 
of Borger, Ardell Briggs of Le- 
fors, Mrs. Mitchell Anderson of 
Clarendon, Mr. and Mrs. Duke 
Gibbs of Belton, Mrs. J. M. Jones 
and Mr. and Mrs. K. M. Briggs of 
Dallas, Mrs. Carey Bell, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ellis Briggs of Estelline, Mr. 
and Mrs. Swift Linley and child­
ren of Amarillo were holiday 
callers in the C. R. Briggs home.

Mr. and Mrs. Sid B. Thomas 
and son of Lockney visited 
friends in this community Friday 
afternoon.

Mrs. J. R. Brandon and sister, 
Mrs. J. C. English of Brice visited 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. E. N. 
Cole in Amarillo Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. N. D. Hill and 
children have moved to our com­
munity, the Mrs. Holland’s place.

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Swinburne 
and Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Jones 
of Midway visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Ben Chamberlain at Claude Sun­
day afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Kermit Evans and 
family were in Memphis Satur­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. C. G. Knox of 
Lelia Lake have been visiting Mr. 
and Mrs. Van Knox.

Sammy Norman of Amarillo 
spent the weekend with his aunt

Mrs. Slaton Mahaffey and fam­
ily.

Mrs. Mary Clayton of Amarillo 
spent Thanksgiving with Mr. and 
Mrs. Slaton Mahaffey.

Mr. and Mrs. Otis Denny and 
sons of Amarillo visited her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Van Knox 
over the weekend.

Billy Lee Ramsey of Borger 
spent the holiday and weekend 
in the Ben Lovell home.

Mr. and Mrs. Willard Cook 
spent Saturday night with Mr. 
and Mrs. W. A. Poovey.

Numerous persons reported a 
very enjoyable day here on Sun­
day. Bro. Johnston, new District 
Superintendent delivered the ser­
mon.__________________ __

Joe Goldston
OPTOMETRIST

Goldston Bldg.
Phono 36

DR. H . R . BECK
D E N T I S T

Phono 46

9 to 12—Office hours— 1 to 5 

Goldston Bldg. 

Clarendon. Texas

INSURE
WITH THE

B U N T I N

BURIAL ASSOCIATION

SAFE, LOW-COST PROTECTION

FOR THE ENTIRE FAMILY

—o r r r e r  a t —

I t t u r p f y v -S p i c c r -B u n t i n
F u n e r a l H om e

24-Hour Ambulance Service Phone 160-A or B

White Paint
UNDERCOAT  —  ENAMEL —  FLAT

Practical
X M A S  G I F T S

Radios, Crosley, Emerson, Medco, U. S. Television

•  Electric Irons with controls

•  Apex & Easy Washing Machines

•  Premier & Apex Vacuum Cleaners

•  Hot Water Tanks - - Butane & Gas

Electric Toaster*, Broilers. Bed Lamps, Stand Lamps

•  Fluorescent Bed Lamps & Fixtures

•  Electric Clocks, Alarm Clocks

•  Silverware & Cutlery

•  Stoves, Fire Places, Andirons

•  Cabinets, Plumbing & Electric supplies

•  Hardware. Sporting Goods of all kinds

•  Ball Bearing Tricycles, many metal Toys

Hundreds of other GIFTS for men. women Sc children.

Complete TOY Department
"YOU ALW AYS SAVE AT THE"

1

PAINT
HUDSON &  TA YLO R

Phone 115

CO
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X o t L e t u .
^  J Mm . J. C. Estlack. Soci.ty Editor v  J  

^    Phono 455  
MRS. JAMES DOUGLAS RILEY 
HONORED WITH SHOWER

Mrs. James Douglas Riley, the 
former Mary Ann Bromley, was 
honored with a miscellaneous 
shower on Saturday, Nov. 23. at 
the home of Mrs. Rayburn Smith 
with Mrs. Carl M. Bennett, Mrs. 
Walter Clifford. Mrs. Clyde 
Douglas, Mrs. Bill Ray and Mrs. 
Rollc Brumley, co-hostesses.

Silver and white was carried 
out in the dining room. The table 
was laid with a white linen cloth. 
A spray of silver magnolia leaves 
with silver cones were interwov­
en as the center piece. White 
rakes and white mints covered in 
silver tinsel wej;c served. Silver 
leaves tied with white satin rib­
bon were used as favors.

Coffee was poured by Ruth 
Patman the first hour and by 
Elisc Norwood the second hour. 
Edith Jo Beckett. Judy Riley and 
June Att. berry helped with the 
serving.

Receiving the guests with the 
hostess and Mrs. Riley were Mrs. 
Bill C. Bromley, mother of the 
bride. Mrs R. R. Riley, mother of 
the groom. Mrs. M. W. Mosley 
and Mrs. Edd Bromley, grand­
mothers of the bride. The bride 
wore her bridal suit, aqua wool 
with a white mum corsage.

Mrs. Millard Wold played tra­
ditional wedding songs and music 
during the first hour followed by 
two readings by Mrs. Carl Ben­
nett. the ‘first humorous and the 
second a beautiful prayer to the 
bride. For the second hour. Sybil 
Head played popular love songs 
and Mrs. Joe Ritter gave an 
original reading written for the

bride.
About seventy five guests reg­

istered in the bride’s book, a gift 
from Mrs. Clifford and about as 
many more sent gifts who were 
unable to attend.

1926 BOOK CLUB
•Mrs. J. R. Porter and Mrs. O. 

D. Lowry were hostesses to the 
1926 Book Club Tuesday, Decem­
ber 3rd. The clubroom was festive 
with Christmas decorations, fea­
turing a color scheme of green 
and silver.

During the business meeting, at 
which Mi's. Bill Bromley presid­
ed, the club voted to have their 
usual Christmas party and gift 
exchange at the home of Mrs. 
Rolle Brumley, Dec. 17.

Mrs. Elba Ballew, reviewer for 
the afternoon, first gave a short 
sketch of the life of Marvyne 
Bauer, author of “Behold Your 
King" and then beautifully re­
viewed tin* book. The story, based 
on the Bible, and using familiar 
Bible characters was intensely in­
teresting, and gave a new insight 
into the life of Christ.

Following the review, Mrs. Joe 
Ritter and Mrs. Frank Phelan 
served dainty refreshments from 
a lace covered table, centered 
with evergreens and silver pine 
cones.

Those present were, guests, 
Mrs. Crawley of Wellington and 
Mrs. Morris of Thalia, and Miss 
Mary Howren, Mesdames Rufus 
White, Paul Shelton and H. W 
Hanks; members present were 
Dr. Laura Lowell, Miss Lucilc 
Polk and Mesdames B. C. Antro- 
bus, Walter Clifford. Frank

White Jr., A. B. Turner, W. C. 
Thornberry, J. G. Stewart, L. T. 
Shelton, Joe Ritter, W. E. Ray, 
Frank Phelan, C. B. Morris, Mar­
guerite Goodner, C. M. Lowry. 
J. R. Gillham, Glen Hoggatt, L. 
N. Cox, Rolle Brumley, Bill 
Bromley, E. S. Ballew, C. E. Bair- 
field, M. R. Allensworth and the 
hostesses.

KAPPA SUB DEBS
The Kappas have voted to have 

two meetings a month. The first 
one on the first Wednesday, 
which is an afternoon meeting 
and the second one on the last 
Wednesday of the month, which 
is a party night. This arrange­
ment has succeeded as the girls 
enjoy one special meeting a 
month.

The Kappas met for their 
monthly party night in the home 
of Sybil Head with Layma Tatum
as co-hostess .The program was 
presented by Ardith Warren. She 
read from the book "A Treasury 
of Stephen Foster.” His many 
beautiful compositions were play­
ed softly on the piano by Nita 
Heath, which provided an atmo­
sphere which held all the girls 
attention.

A delicious salad course was 
served to the following members: 
Nita Heath, Sybil Head, Layma 
Tatum, Dorothy Tatum, Jean 
Porter, Betty Rhodes, Jo Ann 
Blackwell, Lovey Stanley, Sue 
Smith, Lucy Brown, Jo Hoggatt, 
Louvn Hunt, Elise Norwood, 
Ruby Jo Kidd, Jaunita Carpenter, 
Portia Hay, Patsy Pittman, Ard­
ith Warren, Louise Underdown, 
and sponsor, Mrs. Rufus White.

The club has received a regis­
tration blank from the Federation 
of Sub-Debs Clubs, and are ex­
pecting a certificate of member­
ship in the near future.

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

McNEAL—BIVENS
Georgia Bell MeNeal, daughter 

of Mrs. Tommie MeNeal of Clar­
endon, became the bride of John­
ny Bivens Saturday, Nov. 30th at 
the Baptist parsonage here. Rev. 
Hal Upchurch performed the 
marriage ceremony. The bride 
was attended by her mother, Mrs. 
Tommie MeNeal and Mrs. A1 
Cuvington.

For her dress the bride chose 
gray with black accessories. Her 
corsage was of pink roses. For 
something new, her dress, some­
thing old, a Bible of her great­
grandmother’s which is 80 years- 
old; something borrowed, gold 
ear-screws; something blue, a 
handkerchief and a penny in her 
shoe.

Her traveling suit was blue. 
Mrs. Bivens has lived in Claren­
don all her life and finished high 
school. Mr. and Mrs. Bivens will 
be at home, 1618 S. 10th St., 
Abilene.

_Thursday. December 5, 1948

George Watson, Ruth Patman, 
Sue Smith and Kathleen Grady, 
all students of W.T.S.C.. Canyon, 
spent Thanksgiving with their 
parents.

SEE SHAMBURGER LUMBER CO. FOR

- Lumber -
Brick - Tile - Cement 

Wall Paper - Paint
SHOWER STALLS -  WATER HEATERS 

PLUMBING SUPPLIES
Outside and Inside Door Frames 

Ironing Boards -  Cirklair Heaters
i n

W . T. Weatherly, Mgr. Phone 20

Diamond

Ensemble

$25 up

Lapel

Watch

$39.75

Pen

Sets

$5.95 up
Our stock is fairly complete. We invite you to visit us and make your 
selection today. Use our Lay-Away-Plan.

Goldston & Brumley
Jewelers

ALL DAY QUILTING
Mrs. E. G. Hayes entertained 

with an all day quilting Tuesday 
at her home. Two quilts were 
quilted find finished.

The dining table was covered 
with a lovely lace cloth and was 
centered with a vase of beautiful 
white and lavender chrysanthe­
mums which Mrs. Mayfield had 
brought Mrs. Hayes from Los 
Angeles, Calif.

The bountiful covered dish 
luncheon was served at the noon 
hour to minister W. T. Hines and 
wife, their daughter Beatrice and 
baby and Mesdames W. B. May- 
field, Firm Caraway, Claude

Lindsey, U. T. Devcr, Clyde Gil­
bert, R. O. Thomas, Homer 
Thomas, Self, W. W. Dadson and 
hosts, Mr. and Mrs. E. G. Hayes 
and Leona.

Those coming in the afternoon 
were Mesdames C. L. Knight, 
Monte Wolford, Bill Littlefield, 
Adcock, Roy Crutchfield, Oren 
Hott, T. W. Trussed, Tom Mc­
Gowan, U. T. Fowler.

ENTERTAIN WITH 
TURKEY DINNER

n Sunday, December 1st, Mr. 
and Mrs. Pat Slavin, Mr. and Mrs. 
Horace McClellan entertained 
with a turkey dinner at the ranch 
headquarters honoring the em­
ployees of the C. T. McMurtry 
ranches.

Those present were Mr. and 
Mrs. Donda Ray and Don of Mc­
Murtry Bros, ranch, Ashtola; Mr. 
and Mrs. Skcet Brown, Charlotte, 
Betty, and Wayne of A!anreed; 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Vr land, 
Bobby and Mr. Dick Spradlin of 
Memphis; Mr. and Mrs. Emil 
Tipps and Mary, Mr. and Mrs. 
Y. O. Whatley, Mr. Dee Midley 
of Groom; Mr. and Mrs. Horace 
McClellan, Mr. and Mi-s. Clyde 
Slavin. Ann and Charlie; Mr. and 
Mrs. Pat Slavin.

Wednesday morning. Nov. 27th.
The chosen colors of the bride- 

elect, blue and white, were car­
ried out in the dining room, with 
white candles and a centerpiece 
of 6 light chandlier with blue 
bulbs.

Mrs. A1 Covington, and June 
Atteberry presided over the 
Bride’s book. The guest were ir. 
vited into the dining room where 
cup cakes, and coffee were serv­
ed.

During the morning, guests 
were favored with piano solos by 
Edith McCrary.

Fifty-two guests registered, 
and thirty-nine sent gifts.

Joe F. Jones of Clarcndqn is 
now the owner of a long sought 
typewriter. His veteran certifi­
cate enabled him to purchase this 
typewriter at a sale conducted by 
the War Assets Administration at 
Fort Worth.

CLARENDON H. D. CLUB
The Clarendon Home Demon­

stration Club will meet Friday, 
December 13 in an all day Xmas 
dinner and party at the home of 
Mrs. J. C. Estlack.

MISCELLANEOUS SHOWER
Mrs. Bert Smith, assisted by 

Mrs. Colie Huffman, Mrs. R. R. 
Dawkins, Mrs. Bob Head. Mrs. 
J. D. Wood, Miss Mona Church­
man, Mrs. H. C. Brumley, Mrs. 
Hubert Heathcrly, and Mrs. G. G. 
Ayers, honored Georgia Bell Mc­
Neill with a miscellaneous show­
er in the home of Mrs. Bert Smith

James Bellatti spent Thanks­
giving with his wife and new son 
Michael Gene who arrived Nov. 
20th. He weighed 6 lbs., 12 oz. 
Mrs. Bellatti and son are now at 
Stillwater, Okla. Mr. and Mrs. 
John Bellatti and baby accompa­
nied him home Friday night. 
They arc on their way to Califor­
nia where Mr. Bellatti is in the 
Navy.

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to express our thanks 

and deep appreciation for all the 
kindness everyone has shown us 
since the recent loss of our home.

Sincerely,
Mr. and Mrs. Elbert Dolman, Jr. 

and Family.

Mr. and Mrs. Marshall Butler 
who have been visiting his par­
ents, left Wednesday for their 
home at Los Angeles, Calif.

Mr. and Mrs. W. B. Mayfield 
returned home Monday from a 
visit with his mother in Los 
Angeles, Calif.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Bourland 
and Mrs. James Ross and baby 
were Amarillo visitors Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Stewart 
and children were guests of her 
sister and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ben Chamberlain at Claude Sun.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer G. Hayes 
and daughter Leona visited his 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Siddle 
at Memphis Sunday.

Mr. Jim Bourland of Pampa, 
his daughter Mrs. Boesch of Fort 
Worth and daughterinlaw Mrs. 
Chas. Bourland of Dallas were 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Bourland Monday and Monday 
night.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lane and 
sons Wilson and Tommy and his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Lane 
spent Thanksgiving in Amarillo, 
visiting his sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Fowler.

‘We PILE EM HIGH
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Which is another way of saying that at CLARENDON FOOD STORE you can get plenty of fine foods at fine 
savings. We interpret the SUPER in super market very literally and offer super quality, super variety, 

and super economy in every department of our finer food store. So come in today. Select quality foods for 
really super meals from our mammoth displays— and pile your shopping basket high at a low. low cost.

ORANGES
TEXAS

10 MESH BAG

DRESSED

HENS and FRYERS
PLENTY CURED

HAMS and BACON
ANY SIZE

XMAS TREES

C0C0ANUTS
FRESH 

Large Size
EACH

COFFEE 
Magnolia—Pound

OATS
White Swan—Large Box

APPLES
ROMAN BEAUTIES

12c
PURE

Apple Cider
Vi GALLON

65c
CANDY
Assorted Chocolatas— 1 lb. Box 79c

C E L E R Y
LARGE BUNCH

19 c

DATES C Q ~
Pitted— 1 lb. Box ..................... 3 9 C

GINGER BREAD M IX
Duff—Pkg..........................

CAKE FLOUR
Softasilk—Box

PUMPKIN
Del Monte—No. 2 ‘ « Can

CORN
Tendersweet—No. 2 Can

PEAS
Mission—No. 2 C a n ........

PEACHES
Brimfull—No. 2Vt Can

..........

^
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TOO LATE TO 
CLASSIFY

FOE SALE—487 acre farm, give 
possession January 1st. Priced 
for immediate sale. J. Fred 
Smith. Phone 428-M. (42-c)

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADEA. .PAGE FIVE

FOR SALE—9 ft. Kelvinator Re­
frigerator, good condition. Pho. 
392-J or see J. R. Thomas Jr. 
at Clack Radio Service. (42tfc)

TOR SALE — 6-room modern 
stucco home with 3 lots, located 
between schools, two blocks 
Northwest of Junior High Bldg. 
Phone 131-W or see Jake 
LaGrone. (42tfc)

Rev. W. E. Garrison of Tulsa, 
Okla. arrived Wednesday and 
was joined by his wife, Mrs. 
Garrison and Mrs. C. A. Burton. 
All spent Thanksgiving with 
their brother, Mr. and Mrs. W. E. 
Betts of Clovis, N. Mcx.

Mrs. Huffman, Mrs. Bob Head, 
her mother, Mrs. Anderson and 
Sybil Head were Amarillo visi­
tors Saturday.

Mrs. Bert Smith and children, 
Harlene and Don, spent the 
Thanksgiving holidays visiting 
her mother, Mrs. Parish, at 
Shawnee, Okla.

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Estlack 
and family, Allen Homer and 
Donna Jane, spent Thanksgiving 
day visiting relatives at Electra.

Mrs. J. B. Reynolds returned 
Monday from Lubbock where 
she attended her son’s Cpl. Joe S. 
Reynolds wife’s funeral, Sunday.

Mrs. C. T. McMurtry, Mrs. Pat 
Slavin and Miss Jet Downing of 
Amarillo shopped in Dallas Sun­
day till Wednesday of last week.

Mr. and Mrs. C. T. McMurtry 
drove to Oklahoma City Friday 
to attend the stage play “Okla­
homa” Saturday evening. They 
returnod by way of Wichita Falls 
Monday.

Mrs. E. M. Ozier is visiting her 
daughter, Mrs. M. D. Stephens at 
Wichita Falls.

Mrs. Eva Humphrey is visiting 
her son, Mr. and Mrs. John Hum­
phrey and family at Borger.

Dinner guests at Mrs. W. H. ! 
Corbin Sunday were her sons j 
Pet#, Mike and Jake Corbin of ' 
Amarillo, daughters, Mrs. Mary 
Bell Kemp and daughter, Mrs. 
Dorothy Darby, Lawton, Okla.; 
Misses Nell and Ruth Corbin and 
Mrs. Corbin.

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Hurst of 
Abernathy visited in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Bell Monday.

Mrs. Lee Bell and children 
visited Mrs..Chas. Reed at Claude 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ashford and dau­
ghter Joy visited relatives at St. 
Jo Thanksgiving and weekend.

Mrs. E. M. Foster and daughter 
Barbara Ann and Doris Fowler of 
Amarillo spent the Thanksgiving 
holidays with their parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. W. T. Fowler.

Price Whitlock of Amarillo 
visited homefolks Thanksgiving 
day.

Geo. B. Bagby left today for 
Dallas to attend a three day in­
surance convention of the United 
Fidelity Life Insurance Company.

Conoco Farm Program Headed By 
Man Who Started Future Farmers
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M i E S i i j
FURNITURE

APPLIANCES

SUPPLY CO.
J.G. MC AHEAR OWNERS - BILL TOOD

W* 3  civic* nythinj
PHONE 8 CLARENDON

Mince Meat ITALIAN PRUNES 3 1  c
White Swan— No. 2>/a Can ™  * *

75 OZ. JAR

*25c
PEACHES
Gingham Girl— No. 2 ‘/a Can 30c
BEANS with Pork 18c

:  “  PEAS
• V. • * • * 

MARSHALL

Sugar Loaf— Can

Sour Pickle Chips
Mayfair— 11 Vi o*. Jar 21c

NO. 2 CAN

20c CORN
QUICK MEAL 
NO. 2 CAN

SPINACH
LADDIE

CLEANER
PERFEX

15c
BABO

2 FOR

25c

NO. 2 CAN

16c
BOX

23c
COFFEE

FIRESIDE

POUND
BLEACH 20c 43c40% BRAN
Whit* Swan—Large Box . 15c
PURE PORK SAUSAGE 55c CHEESE
SALT CURED BACON 58c LONGHORN

MACARONI 5c POUND

LUNCHtON MCAT A O -
Rath—Can ...................................................................

SANFORD GROCERY
A N D  M A R K E T

Phone 241 W e Deliver

PONCA CITY, OKLA —One of 
the founders of the Future Farm­
ers of America and for many 
years a vocational agricultural 
specialist, Ross Floyd has been 
appointed agricultural service 
manager for Continental oil Com- 
paOny, it was announced here to­
day by Harry J. Kennedy, vice 
president in charge of marketing.

Floyd will assume active 
charge of Continental Oil Com­
pany's agricultural program, 
which provides a broad service to 
those engaged in farm, ranch, 
livestock, and kindred agricul­
tural pursuits, and which in the 
future will also stress the promo­
tion of activities of farm youth.

Floyd joins Continental Oil 
Company after serving the War 
Finance Division, U. S. Treasury 
Department, Washington, D. C., 
as western agricultural repre­
sentative. For the previous eight

A Veterans administration con­
tact office will open in Childress 
November 16th, Robert W. Sis­
son, Manager, West Texas Veter­
ans administration regional office 
at Lubbock, announced today.

The office will be located in 
the basement of the Childress 
County Court House.

Frank S. Bresenhan, Contact 
representative, will be in charge 
of the office, while Luther T. 
Nance, contact representative, 
will conduct itinerate service in 
Donley, Collingsworth, Hall, Mot­
ley, Cottle, Hardeman, Ford, 
Dickens, King and Knox Coun­
ties.

Bresenhan, a veteran of World 
War II. served with the 78th In­
fantry in the European Theater. 
Prior to his present appointment 
ho was Inspector with the Texas 
Liquor Control Board at Lub­
bock. the position he h'dd bet ore 
entering the service. 11 • has : nl 

i the last three months in training 
in the regional office and in con­
tact service in th Lubbock YA 
contact office.

Nance is also a veteran of

World War II, having spent 40 
months in the Army. Before en­
tering the service he was princi­
pal of Fair Park School in Abi­
lene. Since his present appoint­
ment, he has received training in 
the regional office and had done 
contact service in the Abilene VA 
contact office.

Mrs. A. H. Moore, L. P. More, 
Mrs. Harry Blair, Billie Jean 
Knox and Delene Blair shopped 
in Amarillo Tuesday.

Mrs. W. H. Filha of Prcmont, 
Texas is visiting her daughter 
and son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. C. 
P. Emmett.

Mrs. C. E. Griggs is visiting her 
daughter in Norman, Okla.

Legumes and grasses are two 
of nature’s best tools for building 
and maintaining soil fertility.

Gen. Nat S. Perrine of Austin 
was here Tuesday on a matter of 
business.

Mr. and Mrs. Hill and
children spenLTh^tigsgiving in 
Memphis with Relatives. -\

I
Leroy Butler was in Amarillo 

Tuesday on business.

Joy Hoggatt spent Thanksgiv­
ing and weekend with her par­
ents at Lakcvicw.

Mrs. Granville McAnear and 
children and Mrt. Bill Todd were 
shopping in Amarillo Saturday.

Robert Summers of Canyon 
spent Thanksgiving with Jus 
mother, Mrs. R. A. Summers.

Miss Amie Hinkle of Denver 
has returned home after a week’s 
visit with her parents.

Save MILK ON THE CALVES YOU RAISE

f-

___  _
C N E BAG T ££T  ACES 40  GALS. Ok 3 5 0  IBS.  OF MILK

We carry a complete line of Feeds, Poultry 
equipment and Sanitation Products.

CLARENDON GRAIN COMPANY
^ i i s s a s i i i s a ®

ROSS FLOYD

years he had been associated With 
the U. S. Sil Cnservatin Service, 
first as reginal business manager 
at Salma, Kansas, and later as 
reginal administrator at Ama­
rillo, Texas.

From 1925 to 1935 Floyd was 
assistant state supervisor of vo­
cational agriculture for the Slate 
of Oklahoma, and it was during 
this period that he helped to or­
ganize and promote the Future 
Farmers of America. He is also 
widely known as the author of 
numerous authoritative papers 
on agricultural subjects.

Floyd began his career as a 
teacher of vocational agriculture 
in high schools at Nash, Okla., 
and later at Cherokee, Okla. He 
was reared in Oklahoma, receiv­
ing his grade and high school ed­
ucation at Hastings. He attended 
Oklahoma Agricultural and Me­
chanical College at Stillwater, 
where he was graduated in 1922 
with a degree in agricultural edu­
cation and animal husbandry. He 
also took post graduate work at 
Colorado State College, Fort Col­
lins, and at klahcma A&M Col­
lege.

From headquarters at Ponca 
City, Okla., Floyd will direct 
farm service activities in all of 
the 44 states in which Continental 
Oil Company operates.

u a in fe c /
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WITH OUR

Pinto Beans
WHITSONS 

NO. 2 CAN

16c
____..A

PEACHES
MISSION BELL

NO. 2 Vi CAN

30c
ORANGES

TEXAS

70 LB. BAG

Mr. and Mrs. Austin Rhoades 
had for dinner guests Thanksgiv­
ing her mother. Mrs. J. J. Hansen; 
her brother and wife, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ira Hansen and sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Howell Harding and son 
and family. Mr. and Mrs. Loren ' 
Rhoades of Amarillo and Mr. and i 
Mrs. Skeet Brown and family of 
Alanrecd.

"Mini

Mr. and Mrs. Clinton Martin 
and family have moved back to 
Clarendon from Los Animas, 
Colo.

Mr. and Mrs. Owen Pyeatt and 
family of Memphis spent Sunday 
with their son and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gayle Pyeatt.

Mr. and Mrs. A. D. Estlack and 
children were Amarillo visitors 
Saturday.

Mrs. R. W. Moore is at home 
from the Northwest Texas Hos­
pital at Amarillo and doing fine.

Rev. J. L. Ratcliff of Claude 
visited his niece, Mrs. Lola Bams 
Tuesday.

Sgt. Joe Barns was at home 
from a year in Korea and Japan, 
and spent Thanksgiving with his 
mother, Mrs. Lola Barns. He is 
visiting his sister, Mrs. Kolb at 
Raton, N. M.

Mr. and Mi’s. Hunt had their 
children home for Thanksgiving.

Mrs. Carl Lutcn of Pampa was 
a visitor here Wednesday.

SAGE
Dove Brand—Ground

3 02. CAN

12c
TOBACCO
PRINCE ALBERT

7 LB. CAN

95c
CLOROX
PINT BOTTLE

10c

BEANS
Erow n Beauty— 151 2 oz. Can 10c
PEAS
Our Lender. No. 2 Can— Each 10c
PEAS-School Days
Large sugar peas. No. 2 cans— 3 for 50c
PEANUT BUTTER
Bama— Quart Jar 59c
Apricots-Hearts Delight 0 5  r
In Heavy Syrup. No. 2 '/a Cans— 2 for

FRUIT CAKE
Mrs. Franke’s— 1 lb. Can

$100
2 lb. Can $2.00

SUGAR CURE
Carey's. Deep Forest— 10 lb. Sack 55c

Mortons— 7 ‘/a lb. Can 70c

PICKLES
Dill or Sour. Circle R— Quart Jar 35c
ONIONS
Spanish Sweets— Pound

t

£1 0

CHRISTMAS TREES-AnySize

W ALNUTS —  PECANS

FRESH OYSTERS —  FROZEN FOODS

CLIFFORD & RAY
GROCERIES & M EATS

COLD STORAGE LOCKER SERVICE IN  CONNECTION

Phone 5 W e Deliver Phone G
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BARGAIN DAYS! Let us re­
new your subscription for the 
Amarillo Daily News. One 
Year by mail $10.95.

Stocking's Drug Store 
(Amarillo News Agents)

NYAL’S HONEY A H O R E -  
HOUND SYRUP for quick re­
lief of coughs due to colds. Get 
it at

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE—Jersey Heifers. E. V. 
Quattlcbaum. (43-p)

WORMS IN LIVE STOCK —
Globe Phenothiazine is the 
safest and surest remedy for 
removing worms from pigs, 
horses und cattle.

Stocking's Drug Store
Automatic Record Changers. Can 

attach to any radio.
White Auto Store 

Phone 162

FOR SALE—Cedar and Pines at 
Mrs. John Goldston farm.
Phone 947F2. (42-c)

WATERGLASS sold in bulk at 
Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE — 6 ft. Electric Re­
frigerator, priced right. Sam 
Darden, phone 383-M. (41tfc)

TRACTOR MAGNETOS
NEW or USED for John Deere, 

Case, Oliver, Allis-Chalmers, 
I-H-C, Moline and others. 

Homer Bones Garage
(7tfc)

BULK SULPHUR at
Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE—Mrs. Hatchett’s sec­
tion of land about one half mile 
north of Martin school. Two 
sets of improvements. Can give 
possession first of year. W. N. 
Martin. (42-p)

FOR SALE — 24” boys Bicycle, 
good condition. Phone 379-M.

(41tfc)

FOR SALE—Cane bundles, about 
5,000, 8c bundle, 7Vz miles west 
of Clarendon on highway. 
Raymond Waldrop. (43-p)

CATTLE — Protect your cattle 
from blackleg, Secpticemia and 
other mixed infections with the 
SAFER, SURER and LARGER 
doses of the more potent 
GLOBE BACTERINS A VAC­
CINES. *

Stocking's Drug Store 
(Agents)

FOR SALE—Chest of Drawers, 5 
drawers; large ice box, proce- 
lain lined; also 32 Police special 
revolver. Inquire at Leader of­
fice. John Just. (42-c)

Just received shipment Gener­
ators and other Auto Parts. 

White Auto Store 
Phone 162

DEHORNING CATTLE — Stop 
bleeding with GLOBE A-B-C 
BLOOD - CLOTTING Powder. 
Stops hemorrhage now. 

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE — 1937 Buick Sedan. 

Sec Robt. Scmrad. (42-p)

m

SORE, THROAT— TONSILIf ISi 
YOU WANT QUICK RELIEF!
For prompt roliof from pain and discomfort 
try DURHAM ’S ANATHISIA-MOF. It
it a Doctor'i Proscription combining a local 
anotthotic and a powerful germicidal dye 
in a ploasant-taiting solution. Powerful and 
effective, doei not burn tender throat mem­
brane! and li tafe far children. You muit 
agree If it the belt throat mop ever used 
or purchase price will be refunded. Gen- 
eroui bottle, with mop-tticki, only 50c at 
your druggist or of

Douglas 8c Goldston Drug Co.

WORM Y O U R  P O U L T R Y  
FLOCKS safely with no loss in 
egg production. Use Dr. Sals- 
bury’s Rota Caps. For Sale at 

Stocking's Drug Stora

GENUINE INDIAN JEWELRY 
handcrafted by the Zuni and 
Navajo Indians. Buy the genu­
ine bought direct from the 
Indian Reservation out West.

Stocking's Drug Store

FIRST AID KITS—Large ship­
ment Johnson A Johnsons First 
Aid Kits in Tin. Boy A Girl 
Scout sizes. Home and Travel 
kits. For sale at

Stocking's Drug Storo
SACCHARIN TABLETS— Three 

bottles limit to customer. 
Stocking's Drug Stors

DOLL CONTEST
Girls 12 years or under 
enter now for holidays. 

Douglas A Goldston 
Tha Rexall Stora

(42-2c)

MODERN MOTHERS AGREE!
That Darhoai’t Hs-Ma-Rab Is a  stors
modern preparation far relieving discom­
fort of children's simple chest colds. Doc­
tors like its 2 9 %  Guiacol-Camphor formula 
for H vaporises better and affords a stronger 
counter-irritant effect. Try Ne-Mo-Reb for 
croupy coughs. Dasbl# tha purchase
C4ee refunded if you do not find Ne- 

O-Rab a superior chest rub. 35c and 60c 
jars at your Druggist a» at

Douglas & Goldston Drug Co.
CALIFORNIA FINE INCENSE— 

Fragrance of Desert Flowers, 
Pine, Redwood and Orange 
Blossom brings outdoor fresh­
ness to indoor stuffiness. Get 
it at

Stocking's Drug Stora

1. Hold Your U. S. War Bonds
Don’t let anyone talk you into cashing them. Be 
wary of "get-rich-quick” schemes. Extravagant 
promises are a poor substitute for the safety and 
guaranteed return of your War Bonds.

2. Buy U. S. Savings Bonds
They are identical with Series “ E” War Bonds and
both are the world’s best investments-----backed
by the full resources of the United States Govern-
m ant returning $4 at maturity tor every $3 you
invest.

HELP EIGHT INFLATION BY BUYING U. S. 
SAVINGS BONDS— BY DOING SO YOU ARE 

ALSO HELPING YOURSELF.

See us about buying or selling any kind 

of U. S. Government Bonds.

F irst National Bank
CLARENDON. TEXAS

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

TRUSSES THAT FIT — Guaran­
teed truss-fitting at

Stocking's Drug Storo

MITES. BLUEBUGS, TERMITES 
E a s i l y  Exterminated with 
AVENARIUS C A R B O L I N -  
EUM. Buy it at

Stocking'! Drug Store

FOR SALE— Good team horses, 
weight about 2,500 lbs.; also 
good harness. Will trade for 
hogs, heifers, or cuws. Box 132, 
Phone 10. G. G. Turner, Good­
night, Texas. (44-p)

Book your Christmas Turkeys be­
fore the 15th. Fred Whitaker, 
Vz mile southeast of Clarendon.

(43-p)

All metal Wagons with hard rub­
ber wheels for tiny tots, only 
$1.49.

Whit* Auto Store
Phone 162

FOR SALE — Good Oil Heater 
and Cream Separator. Call 399 
or see Mrs. Monica Harvey.

(42-p)

J. P. POOL
Real Estate

Farms A City Property 
Res. 353-J Phone Day 81-J

Here is something new to help 
you solve your gift problems.
"BOOKS OF HAPPINESS"
Theatre Coupon Gilt Books 

$1.00 $2.50 $5.00
A gilt that will be appreciated 
by all lor Birthdays. Christmas 
or Special Occasions.

Now on Sals 
at Tha Mulkey Theatre

FOR SALE — Young roan Bull, 
natural muley, priced right, on 
highway, Vz way between Lelia 
Lake and Hedley; also milk 
cows. J. C. Wynn. (42-p)

For SALE—Thoroughbred Cock­
er Spaniels, 6 weeks old. Will 
make lovely Xmas presents. 
Phone 152 M. (42tfc)

CATTLE GRUB KILLER — Use 
Globe Grub Killer powder to 
kill grubs in backs of cattle. 
Dust it on. It may improve 
quality of hide, increase weight 
a n d  m i l k  p r o d u c t io n .

Stocking's Drug Store

Cold weather is here and we 
have a few gas heaters left. 

White Auto Store 
Phone 162

\B
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Ot/M 'KNOW HOW" /STOURPOOD FORTUNE/

K E I I V
C l IAMBI.RLAIN
A l l  I v p r s  —  .A ll  K i n d s

I ’K O M I*  I A D M  M M I N M

A VISIT to our modern service depart­
ment will convince you that our 

' ’know-bow” is your good fortune. Not 
only do you get the benefits of our out­
standing service facilities, but our me­
chanics will overhaul and recondition your 
John Deere Farm Equipment the way it 
should be done. This means quick, efficient

service at less cost to you. You'll be amazed 
at the completeness . . . the fine work . . . 
the results you get.

You can depend on i t . . .  there’ll be no 
unnecessary work. Our estimates will cover 
everything needed to put your,equipment 
in "tip-top” condition. See us the next 
time you're in town.

BENNETT IMPLEMENT CO.
JOHN DEERE TRACTORS & IMPLEMENTS 

Phono 52

, i / t f C ?  O N L Y  C f N U I N C  J O H N  D F t  R I P O R T S  
yCrt'Ftt* - * 1 FI T O N D  W E A R  L I K E  T H E  O R I G I N A L S

SCOURS IN CALVES — Stop 
white scours in baby calves 
with Globe antibacterial sei-um. 
Just shoot it under the hide. 

Stocking's Drug Store

Just received shipment of Medi­
cine Cabinets, 14x18, two shelv­
es with mirror, $2.89.

White Auto Store 
Phone 162

FOR SALE — Beautiful child’s 
Bedroom suite, solid maple, ex­
cellent condition. Phone 35-B.

(42-c)

XMAS TREE SETS
Christmas Cards 8c Seals 

Manicure Sets, La Cross Sets 
Fitted Cases, Dresser Sets 

The Rexall Store
(42-2c)

W A N T E D
FARMERS

You are losing money if you don’t 
bring me your green cards or 
samples before you sell your 
cotton. I have best price in 
Donley County; Try me and 
see. Alabama Hill, Hedley.

(42-p)

WANTED—Young man. No ex­
perience required. Shamburger 
Lumber Co. (43tfc)

Will keep children while mothers 
go Xmas shopping. Reasonable 
price—at the College Dormi­
tory apartments. (43-p)

RAT ANTU — Use Cook’s Antu 
Wonder Rat-Bait. Twenty tim­
es more powerful than red 
squill. Buy it at

Stocking's Drug Stora

WANTED—Ironing to do. Con­
tact college Dormitory apart­
ments. (43-p)

MANTLE GIFT LAMPS
Love Light Lamps 
Table Tennis Sets 

Bibles Sc Wedding Books 
Nylon Brushes 

Tha Raxall Stora
(42-2c)

USE I. P. A. OINTMENT 
It is tha traatmant of unsightly 
PIMPLES. ACNE SIMPLEX 

Distrassing Impetigo, Itching 
Athlata's Foot, Ring Worm, Poi­
son Oak. Bar bars Itch, Eczema, 
and Shingles. WORKS LIKE 
MAGIC 1 Gat at Drug Stores or 
I. P. A. Mfg. Co., McKinney 
Texas. (6 mos.-c)

--------Thursday, Dscember 5. 1945

MISCELLANEOUS
WARREN - CHEHAULT 

Income Tax Service
Offices: 209 Goldston Building 

Clarendon, Texas 
J. A. Warren E. J. Chenault.

Office Mgr.

CITY CAFE now under new 
management. Come in’ any time 
- - you’re welcome. Waffles 
served at all hours. Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed Foster. (45-p)

TRY OUR

ONE DAY

CLEANING SERVICE
Wa Are Equipped to do it,

SMITH CLEANERS
Phone 189

Wa Pickup and Dalivar

PIANO LESSONS
Mrs. Pag# Harmon

5 blocks South of Junior College 
at old Condron place. Phone 
480-R. (41tfc)

Mr. and Mrs. C. P. Emmett and 
Mrs. W. H. Filba and Mr. and 
Mrs. R. T. Brown were Amarillo 
shoppers last week.

See the Rexall for Gifts—
Mens Gift sets 

Ladies Gift Sets 
Soaps and Bath Bubbles 

Tha Raxall Stora
(42-2c)

Sidewalk Bicycles, Tricycles, 
Wagons and Paracycles 

White Auto Stora 
Phone 162

FOR SALE—Philco Radio, cabi­
net model, battery set; also gas 
cook stove. J. L. Butler, phone 
914712, Lelia Lake. (42tfc)

FOR SALE—Mash fed Turkeys, 
45c live weight, 70c dressed de­
livered. Please book orders be­
fore December 16th. Mrs. C. L. 
Mann, P. O. Box 465, City. Two 
miles south of Chamberlain 
school (43-p)

FOR SALE—3 burner cook stove 
with oven; 1 burner oil heater. 
Call 129-J or see Mrs. N. L. 
Jones. (42-c)

FOR SALE— 5 room house and 
bath, newly refinished, close in. 
See Ed Speed. (40-p)

FOR SALE—One saddle (roping 
style) with blanket and bridle. 
Leroy Vaughn at E-Z Laundry.

(41tfc)

Dr* Keith S* Lowell
GENERAL PRACTICE 

A N D  SURGERY

Offices in Goldston Bldg. 
Offioa Phone 12$ 

Phone 174

For His XMAS—New 1947 Boats, 
In-Board Sc Out-Board Plastic 
Boats. Car Top Boats. New 
Johnson Out-Board Motors. 
Good Bargains in used motors 
and Boats. Fishing Tackle, 
Marine Supplies. Terms. Bert 
A. Howell, Lake McClellan.

(44-c)

FOR SALE—200 gallon Superior 
Butane Tank, about 100 feet 
of pipe and connections. A. C. 
Rackley, 3 miles west of City 
water tower on Jack Bailey 
place.

FOR SALE — Clarendon Coffee 
Shop. Newly refinished and 
good weekly take-in. See 
Johnnie Tucker. Phone 291-J.

(42'P)
FOR SALE — New modern rock 

house, 4 rooms and bath. Con­
tact Virgil Hampton at wreck­
ing yard or phone 329-J. (39tfc)

COLD FEET—Sleep warm with 
Hospital type Heating Pad. 
Cushion comfort with medicin­
al benefits. Relieves Neutritis 
and other aches and pains. The 
best at

Stocking's Drug Stora

FOR SALE — Cafe, new equip­
ment and newly decorated, 
seats 35 people, gross take-in 
$700 per week, owner selling 
on account of other business 
interests. A good buy for quick 
sale. Horse Shoe Cafe, Bill 
Mounts, Mgr., Box 321, Well­
ington, Texas. (42-p)

WESTERN POTTERY — H a n d- 
painted Western Pottery done 
in colors portraying ranch 
scenes with famous brands. 

Stocking's Drug Stora

DR. J. W . EVANS

D E N T I S T

Clarendon. Taxas

|MAS RESUMED PRACTICE

—Of Lea Hours—

1:30 p. m. to 5:00 p. m.

D A N C E
little Joe Wright’s Band

A N D  RADIO SHOW TROUPE
of Minot, North Dakota

Are touring the country and will play for a dance 
at the

Clarendon Opera House 
Saturday, Dec. 14th
Admission - - - $1.00 per person 

9 p. m. Till - - - ?

DO YOU W A N T A  HOME IN CLARENDON?

W e have three or four choice bargains.

Plenty of four percent money, 20 years, annual 

interest, no inspection fee, no stock to buy.

See us for a new loan, or let us
I

take up your old one.

Three full time life underwriters, from three to 

thirty years experience to serve you.

George A. Ryan & Associates
19 :-i Phones i-t 92

•omra i k»  wmomr of m  com** n
MEMPHIS COCA-COLA  SOTTLfNO COMPANY

,-nw EBBKS

■

_________________  ‘
 ̂ murT it*tii . „r

-
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THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER
This report will cost you nothing 
extra, so please give this your 
immediate attention.

This is the last opportunity for 
other classes to file their Esti­
mated Reports, also, if you have 
not already done so, or to amend 
any reports already made.

If in doubt, consult this office 
for expert dnd experienced ad­
vice.

Warren-Chenault, 
Income Tax Service, 
Goldston Bldg., 
Clarendon, Texas.

Mrs. J. T. Warren of Amarillo 
visited Mrs. R. T. Brown Monday.

and family at Plainview.
Mrs. Ray Roberson and child­

ren of Pampa are visiting her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Jor­
dan this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Grady Parson of 
Hereford visited her mother, Mrs. 
J. A. Pool and Mr. and Mrs. Rich­
ard Cannon Thanksgiving.

C. F. and Ellen Brown of Ama­
rillo visited Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Morrow Saturday.

Freeman Helton of Fritch visit­
ed home folks this weekend.

Mr. D. L. Jacobs of Amarillo 
spent the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. L. O. Christie.

Mrs. J A Pool will visit Mr. 
and Mrs. Archie H. Pool at Abi­
lene this week.

Mr. and Mrs. F. C. Crofford and 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Cannon at­
tended the supper sponsored by 
Borden’s in Amarillo last week.

Mrs. Bill Craig visited hei 
mother, Mrs. J. E. Craig of Wash- 
bum last weekend.

The Martin Quilting Club will 
meet with Mrs. Guy Sibley 
Thursday of this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy J. Land are 
visiting in Missouri this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Barker and 
family visited his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Barker of the Hud-

at Columbia Seminary, and stud­
ied later in Tulane University in 
New Orleans. He became pastor 
of the St. Charles Avenue miss­
ion, a branch of the First Presby­
terian Church of New Orleans, in 
1917. Under his leadership, the 
mission was soon organized as a 
church, and has rapidly grown to 
be one of the outstanding church­
es in the Southern Presbyterian 
Assembly. Dr. Land has contribu­
ted to the Christian Century Pul­
pit and other religious periodi­
cals.

The subject of Dr. Land's ad­
dress next Sunday morning will 
be, “Crowding Out Worry.”

This radio broadcast can be 
heard in Clarendon over radio 
station KGNC, Amarillo.

gins community Thanksgiving 
day.

Mrs. F. C. Crofford, Margie 
Nell and Mr. and Mrs. F. G. Crof­
ford visited Mrs. Nora Williams 
of Wellington Thanksgiving day.

George Bulman, Gene Bulman, 
Billy J. Jordan and Nelson Chris­
tie attended the football game at 
Abilene Saturday.

Miss Glenda Davis of Amarillo 
spent the weekend with home- 
folks.

Velma Tims spent the week 
with Edna Tims.

Mr. and Mrs. Virge Littlefield 
from Goldston and Mr. and Mrs. 
Pat Myers and Mr. Levi Foster 
frpm Hudgins visited Mr. and 
Mrs. W. G. Tims and family Sun.

You are invited to all church 
services.

9:45 a. m.—Sunday School.
11:00 a. m.—Morning Worship.
6:00 p. m.—Young Peoples Fel­

lowship.
7:00 p. m.—Evening Evanelistic 

services.
Ladies Auxiliary meeting Wed­

nesday, Dec. 11th in the home of 
Mrs. J. H. Howze. Mrs. Howze 
and Mrs. Chas. Blackburn are the 
hostesses. Mrs. Ed Dishman will 
conduct the program of study 
The Joy Gifts for aged minister? 
and their dependents will be re­
ceived. Christmas boxes and bas­
kets will be arranged.

CHRISTMAS PAGEANT
Work will soon begin on the 

Christmas Pageant which will be 
rendered the Sunday night before 
Christmas.

We humbly urg~ every membei 
and friend of the church to be 
present at least every Sunda> 
morning in the church services 
The most important hour during 
the whole week is the clever 
o ’clock hour in public worship ir 
God’s House.

♦ Dorothy Terry ♦
+ + + + + ♦ + + + + ♦ + + * ♦ +

We had a nice crowd out for 
Sunday school Sunday. We hope 
to have a larger crowd next Sun­
day. Bro. Roberts will preach for

The Martin community enjoyed 
another Thanksgiving dinner at 
the school house Thursday night. 
After dinner was served, F. G. 
Crofford, Howard and Jack Sut­
ton and William Green entertain­
ed the crowd with string music.

Mrs. C. J. Talley returned 
home this week after visiting her 
son, Mr. and Mrs. Aubrey Talley

WITH STRONG VITALITY 
Grown for Texas

Listen to \ KTSA 
Great Stone. \ KRRV Zr&ttST  
About Coro / MfKY

Donley County Leader, $2.50 year
Dr. J. Gordon Stewart

PHYSICIAN  A SURGEON r CO M E ON. DEAR, I J  D A R L IN G .
I JU ST  CAN T LOOK 
AT M Y  HANDS I > 

. D ID  THE W ASH j  
TODAY

METHODIST CHURCH 
H. W. Hanks. Pastor

We are all delighted with our 
new district superintendent, Rev. 
T. M. Johnston. He is evangelis­
tic in his preaching and a friend 
of man. We are glad to have him 
as our collaborator.
• Sunday school at 9:45. Preach­
ing at 10:55. The Intermediates 
and young people meet at 6:15. 
Preaching at seven. As you know' 
the 15th of this month is Orphan­
age day. On this day we are to 
make our contribution to this 
worthy cause. Please see that 
your offering is in the hands of 
♦he church treasurer not later 
than Dec. 20th. If you cannot 
bring your offering please send 
it in.

We appreciate the many good 
things which continue to find 
their way to the parsonage home. 
It humbles us and makes us try 
harder to render you better ser­
vice. Pray for us.

PRO M ISED  WE WOULD 
HAVE A GAME Of BRIDGE 
x W ITH DICK ANO HARY 
v— . -  . TONIGHT

HOW  M A N Y  MORE 
} 'M E S  MUST I TELL 
YOU TO SEND YOUR 

LAUNDRY TO THE

Office in Lataon Bldg

Ground Floor
Office Phone 239

YOUR INCOME TAX
Notice. Farmers:

Your time for filing 1946 Esti­
mated Income Tax Reports must 
be done before Dec. 15th, which 
then will give you until March 
15th to file your annual report. 
If your estimate indicates that 
you owe a tax for 1946, it must 
be paid with Estimated Report.

If for any reason you do not 
file and Estimate, then it will be 
necessary that you file your An­
nual Report before January 15, 
1947. This necessarily gives you 
and us very little time, so it w’ill 
be to your interest and ours if 
you will file an Estimated Report.

Residence Phone 253

(Let's all boost the Clarendon Jr. College 
and Public Schools)

Dr. John S. Land, pastor St. 
Charles Avenue Presbyterian 
Church, New Orleans, Louisiana, 
will be the speaker on the Pres­
byterian Hour next Sunday 
morning, December 8; at 7:30. 
over an independent network of 
southeastern radio stations.

A South Carolinian by birth, 
Dr. Land attended Presbyterian 
College in South Carolina, from 
which he was graduated in 1914. 
He took his theological trainingMRS. MAULDIN. Dinner Cook 

Delicious Home Cocked Food.

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 
CHURCH

Rev. Charley B. Robinson. Pastor 
Phone 267-M

Christ calls all people from sin 
into the abundant life. He said: 
“Let your light so shine among 
men that they may see your good 
works and glorify your Father 
who is in Heaven.” Sunday calls 
you to God’s House.

RAKE f/VTEXAS LARGE JUICY

GrapefruitTender Steaks. French Fries 
Tasty Sandwiches. Big Hamburgers

24 Hour Service

WE WILL PAY TOP PRICE FOR YOUR EGGS

APPLES

CELERY
15c

V K
ORANGES

DOZEN

Brittle Candy
Our G ift Shop is a galaxy of gift stars-----every one beamed to yourChristmas list! Delightful gifts for the ladies, the home, the small fry, and gifts for the men. Come see the dazzling dozens of gift stars-----here now!

CURED HAMS
WHOLE

PECANSCome in and let us help you 
with your Gift list. Pure Pork Sausage

COUNTRY STYLE
POUNDNorwood Pharmacy

Prescription Specialist* Pboi

(( YOU so n . EM -  OUR WASHERS CLEAN EM
Phone 26 1 Clarendon

PLENTY SHREDDED COCONUT 
Fruit Cakes.. . . . . . . . from 49c up to S2.50 each
Yukons Best White Corn Meal-25 lb. sack $1.59
CRACKERS—2 lb. B ox . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 45c
SALAD DRESSING—Pint Jar.. . . . . . . . . . . . 3 5c
FRUIT COCKTAIL Q Q  
White Swan—No. 2>/t Can .... O w C CHILI Q A / .Van Campt— Tall Can V "T C

" S T  Folgers Coffee
MORTON SUGAR CURE A C  
Large Box O v C

CAKE FLOUR Q Q
Swamdown—Large Box V V V

PICKLES
Sour—Quart Jar f c V v

B U C K  PEPPER
fl

SOAP A
Silver Foam—Box O '

9

5c

Yukon’s Best Flour—25 lb. Sack. . . . . . . . $1.59
PURE U R D —4 pounds. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $1.75
_______________________________________________________________________-

| SALT PORK BACON-Pound.. . . . . . . . . . . . 5 9c
| BEEF ROAST-Pound .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3 11c
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Mr. James Yarbrough is recov­
ering from a foot injury received 
in a truck accident on Highway 
18 between Clarendon and Jeri­
cho. Mr. Yarbrough is employed 
by P. B. Stovall, Dallas, Tex;is.

Mrs. Myrtle Ayers, of Marshall, 
Texas was dismissed .Tuesday af­
ternoon after having had a com­
plete clinical examination. Mrs. 
Myrtle Ayers was formerly Mrs. 
Myrtle Smith of McLean, Texas.

Mr. and Mrs Warren Bray and 
two sons of Dallas visited here 
Thanksgiving holidays with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. G. R. Grant 
and tier sister and husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Clyde Hudson, return­
ing home Sunday.

Mrs. John S. Morgan was rush­
ed to the hospital Monday even­
ing after becoming suddenly ill. 
She is now in a very critical con­
dition.

illllh.

A U C T I O N  S A L E
Thursday, December 12th

12 miles East of Clarendon on Naylor Route on 
what is known as the old Woods place. 7 miles 
Northeast of Lelia Lake in Naylor Community.

D. L. Vaughan, owner
Sale starts promptly at 10:30 A. M.

FREE COFFEE—Sandwiches offered for sale.
M. L. PUTMAN. Auctioneer

John H. Crawford and family. 
Mrs. Roy Brinson of Ashtola and 
daughters, also Mrs. E. E. McNeal 
of Clarendon spent Thanksgiving 
at Moran with Mr. and Mi's. W. 
A. Baton. They enjoyed turkey 
and squirrel plentiful.

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

Manley Bryan is at home from 
University of Colorado. The 
school closed due to the scarcity 
of coal.

Thursday, December 5. 1946

Mr. and Mrs. Herman Cross of 
Santa Fe, N. M.. formerly of 
Brice, have moved to Moran 
whore Herman will be connected 
with the Baton Grocery & Mkt. 
Herman has just been out of the 
service a short while.

Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Lewtcr of 
Oakland, Calif., Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Lewter of Claude, Texas; 
Mr. Roy Lewter of Pampa, Tex­
as; Mr. and Mrs. I. N. Allard and 
grand daughters of Amarillo; 
Clifford Skipworth and girl 
friend of Amarillo, all ate 
Thanksgiving dinner with Mrs. 
D. T. Lewter and Mr. and Mrs. 
R. T. Brown.

Miss Wanda Nell Bagwell was 
dismissed from the hospital this 
week after recovering from a 
fractured nose sustained when 
hit with a baseball bat.

Helen Porter, Billy Ralph 
And is and Carl Morris spent 
Thanksgiving with homcfolks. 
They have returned to the Uni­
versity at Austin.

Mrs. Rolle Brumley and daugh­
ter Shirley and Mrs. Carl Ben­
nett were shopping in Amarillo.

Mr. and Mi’s. Frank Hommel 
and Geraldine and Mrs. Reddell 
Henson were in Amarillo Mon.

Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Taylor from 
Pampa had Thanksgiving dinner 
Sunday with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. L. L. Taylor.

Mary Frances Word from J.A. 
ranch has accepted a position in 
the Tax Assessors office at 
Claude.

Mr. and Mrs. F. E. Chamberlain 
were Amarillo visitors Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Jones of 
Amarillo had Thanksgiving din­
ner with his mother, Mrs. M. C. 
Goodner and Tom.

Albert Whitsell of Dallas and 
Mr. and Mrs. Calvin Naylor of 
Wichita Falls spent the holidays 
with their mother, Mrs. A. L. 
Whitsell.

Mrs. C. Daughtry of Ft. Worth 
is visiting her mother, Mrs. Man- 
ley'and sister, Mrs. Allen Bryan.

Mrs. Roy Clark and daughter 
of Groom visited Mrs. Howard 
Stewart Tuesday.

Mrs. E. A. Thompson of Fort 
Worth visited Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Morgan last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Blackwell 
of Amarillo visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Morgan last week.

Anna lynn Barns of Ft. Worth 
and Edwin Barns of Amarillo 
spent the weekend with their 
mother, Mrs. Lola Barns.

NOTICE TO COWMEN
W e have in stock at our mill in Amarillo—

•  41% COTTONSEED CUBES

•  41% COTTONSEED MEAL

•  21% RANGE CUBES

W e can also make car load delivery 
to your shipping point.

Call or write us for prices. 

Telephone L. D. 30. 2-3340 

P. O. Box 1650

Amarillo Oil Mill Company
B ! mam. .

THEY A l l  W ANT

T w  o *
Visit our store and look over our wide selection of 
toys such as guns, dolls, pull toys, games and 
many others.

For the grown-ups, we have - - -
A NEW PHILCO RADIO COMBINATION 
THOR & GLADIRON MANGLES

RUNDELL & ESTLACK
Philco Radios & Refrigeration

Those visiting in the <Bjyson 
home Sunday were Glenn Hearne | 
of Ft. Worth, Mr. and Mrs. Jess l 
Rutherford, Mr. aiuj Mrs, J, T. | 
Thomas and childrc \s. Mary I
Turner and daugBterp atf* of 
Claude, and Mr. and 4Rrs. Her­
man Hearne, Mr. and Mi's. Mick­
ey Joe Hearne and son, l !H K  of 
Amarillo and Mrs. N. !». Nickell 
of Goodnight.

-------------------------- c
Sliek Naylor ana children 

Bettie and Jim from Conway 
spent the Thanksgiving Jijgidays 
with relatives. Ben ancmKrginia 
are visiting their aunts at Carls­
bad, N. Mex.

Mrs. L. C. Parker of Elcctra 
is visiting her daughter and fam­
ily, Mr. and Mrs. H. T. Warner.

Lcta Fern Phillips of Pampa 
spent the holidays with her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. J. H. 
Hunt.

Mrs. W. S. Hearne returned I 
home from Ft. Worth Thursday 
where she had been visiting for 
some time.

CELERY
CANDY
Shredded Coconut

Apples
COFFEE
KETCHUP
Vienna Sausage

Juice
SHAMPOO 
MEAT CURE 
GRAPEFRUIT

Oranges
S O A P
CLOTHES PINS 
PORK CHOPS

LARGE PASCAL— STALK 20f «
Regular white—Stalk .............................................. I 9 C

LOOSE WILES M .
1 lb. Chocolate* ..................................................... . V  I  C

Vi pound ......................................................... 55c
Fancy B ox D elicious— lb ............12 Vi c l  1

Large Roman Beauty—Pound ................................ ^

ADMIRATION— LB. 39* A F
Fireside—Pound ........................................................W w C

14 os. Bottle 25c
CAN . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   19c

ADAMS ORANGE

«  01. O J C
MODART 59c
MORTONS C C
Can ...............................................................................D O C

MARSH SEEDLESS " jP~
1 Pound ........................................................................  D C

" "  AQ r
8 lb. Sack .................................................  J0

~SWEETHEART “ i f ”
3 Bars ......................................................................... * D C

SPRING K IND  4 A
1 Dosen   |QC
GOOD LEAN  M 7
1 Pound ...................................................................... D D C

MULKEY THEATRE

LAST TIMES FRIDAY— "GALLANT JOURNEY'

S A T U R D A Y  O N L Y
LUM and ABNER

—in—
PARTNERS IN  TIME'

S U N D A Y  A N D  M O N D A Y

TUESDAY ONLY— BARGAIN DAY

DOROTHY LAMOUR and RAY MILLAND

—in—

"JUNGLE PRINCESS

W E D N E S D A Y  —  T H U R S D A Y  —  F R I D A Y

Pathe Newt Fox News

PASTIME THEATRE— Saturday Only— "THE TRAIL TO VENGANCE'

PRICES REDUCED
O N  L A D IE S  F A L L

Coats Suits & Dresses

25 to 50
Two Cases (1500 yds.) P R I N T S  80 Square 39c & 49c yd

Childrens F A L L  C O A T S  25%  off

C. R E E N F
DRY GOODS COMPANY
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IF a pencil mark appears in 
this box, your subscription 
has expired. Please let us j 
have your renewal promptly. j

I

1878

The LEADER brings your 
friends and acquaintances 
near you every week. Keep 
your subscription paid up.
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S Q R !F V $ £
N EW S
McLEAN, Texas (Special) — 

The former Prisoner of War 
Camp here will be the scene of 
tremendous activity in alleviat­
ing the current shortage of hous­
ing for World War II veterans 
starting December 16 when War

Assets Administration opens a 
sale of $300,000 worth of lumber, 
plus untold quantities of plumb­
ing, heating, electrical wiring and 
20,00(J feet of critically short sup­
ply pipe.

John M. McGee, field director 
of WAA in charge of the McLean 
sale, announced that only holders 
of HH priority certificates, issued 
by the NHA or the CPA would be 
eligible to purchase for the first 
five days of the sale, December 
16 through 20.

McGee stated that purchase's

A Common Paper for Common People

would be limite'd to veterans 
seeking to obtain materials to 
erect or to complete one five 
room individual dwelling, or to 
contractors seeking to obtain 
such materials to build a 5-room 
home for sale to a veteran.

HH priority certificates may be 
applied for by veterans at the 
nearest Federal Housing Agency 
office to their homes, and farm­
ers seeking certification for erec­
tion of farm buildings should 
make application to the Agricul­
tural Extension Service.

Immediate application, should 
be made by those interested in 
securiug the required HH prior­
ity certificate to insure having it 
by the opening date of the sale, 
December 16th.

More than 300 buildings at Mc­
Lean POW Camp have now been 
taken down and the materials 
stockpiled in preparation of the 
opening of this huge WAA sale.

Searchlights of the McLean 
Prisoner of War Camp arc going 
on sale through the War Assets

Administration as surplus prop­
erty in excess of the current or 
anticipated needs of the armed 
forces December 5 to 20.

Priority claimants, including 
veterans of World War II, RFC 
buying for small business, state 
and local governments, non-profit 
institutions and commercial buy­
ers are invited by WAA to submit 
orders concurrently, orders to be 
filled in the priority sequence.

There are 32 lot offerings con­
taining searchlights of various

types, prices ranging from $110 
to $258.49. One lot of 11 electric 
storage batteries is also being o f­
fered at $83.71. The sale closes 
December 20, following which 
awards will be made.

To date about 200 chapels lo­
cated on military installations 
have been declared surplus and 
War Assets Administration ex­
pects to have between 500 and 
600 declared surplus and avail­
able for disposal. Eleven chapels 
at Cam]) Howze and two at Camp

Fannin are among 30 thus far dis­
posed. WAA is seeking to effect 
equitable distribution and all in­
quiries regarding acquiring a 
surplus chapel should be address­
ed to WAA. T&P Bldg., Fort 
Worth.

NEW GRANDSON
Robert Wayne Eastlake is the 

new son born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Phifer I. Eastlake at Denison, 
Nov. 27, 1946. He weighed 7 lbs., 
6 ounces. Hi' is the grandson of 
Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Estlack.

Are You Interested?----- W e Are!
This page is sponsored and prepared by the fifty-three G .I/s attending Clarendon Junior College and Clarendon High School, a 
portion of whom were awarded the purple heart and a large percentage of whom were combat veterans. A number of these G .I/s 
are married and have children who will be entering public schools in the near future.

Which Do You Choose?
TO VOTE FOR THE INCREASE IN SCHOOL T A X  WHICH MEANS:

1. To keep and enlarge the present Junior College and to give us an oppor­
tunity to secure the education to which we feel we are entitled.

2. To keep the present high standard of instruction in our college and public 
schools by being able to pay teachers a wage comparable to that paid in 
other junior colleges and public school systems, and ability to compete with 
other systems for services of well qualified instructors.

3. Ability to move and erect the gymnasium awarded to the local school 
board by the U. S. government at a small portion of its value and thus to 
provide proper facilities for Physical Education as required by la£ -  fo* 
interscholastic basketball and boxing, and all other activities for which 
gymnasium is a requirement.

4 The maintaining ol the present high ranking of the high school and iunior 
ioUeae and S ?  of students to transfer their credits from e.ther of the 
schooTs to all accredited high school, and coliege. in the ent.re south.

5. Prevention of drop in aluatlon of property due to lack of a college and 
inadequate public school system.
c Maintainira of facilities for all students in this locality to secure at least 
t o  y e a r /o f  9college work regardless of their financial standing.

7. Ability to do needed repair, and upkeep of school properties and to secure 
additional equipment as needed.
8. Maintaining reputation as an educational center in the Panhandle of 
Texas.
9. Additional college facilities to help hold the present college students and 
to attract other students to the college.

TO VOTE AGAINST THE INCREASE IN SCHOOL T A X  W H ICH  M EANS:

1. The end of the Clarendon Junior College and the end of our opportunity 
to secure a college education. Most of us can stay at borne and secure 
enough education that with our additional training under tbe G.I. Bill we 
can obtain four years of college work.

2. Sub-standard or no teachers at all in the Clarendon Public schools.

3. No Gymnasium, no sports program for college students, and consequent 
failure to comply with the state requirement for physical education.

•4. Inadequate facilities for interscholastic basketball and boxing.

5. Loss of reputation by the town as an educational center.

6. A big drop in property valuations due to loss of college and a lower 

evalued public school system.

7. Loss of opportunity for hundreds of Donley County boys and girls to 

secure a college education.

8. Loss of opportunity of students to secure education at a high school with 
rating similar to Amarillo. Borger. Shamrock. Quanah, Hereford, Perryton, 
Dalhart and other school districts that have voted the tax increase.

. . . .  • riarpnrlnn and every public official was given an opportunity to sign the following statement without
E v e r y  individual or firm doing business in Clarendon, a yP
charge. The following list chose to do sos

. , ,, £ _f ,i . .  Clarendon Junior College and the Clarendon Public School System, and we
W «, (h . ood .r.ign .d  firm . nnd Individual. .p p r .c .  e .  «  inUin ,h.  Clarendon Junior College and Public School Syr-
pledge that wo will . . . .  for -» d  ruppor. tho t .r  in c r c .c  .» d  wdl d .  d .  on, power
.cm ot .ho highe.t level powible improve A c  ..m e  if wc arc c .p .b l .  of d om , .»•

l e e  l e e k
FRANK WHITLOCK 
CHAS. M. LOWRY 
JOE PAGE 
V. L. SMITH 
CARRIE DAVIS 
FORREST McCRARY 
O. F. RUSSELL 
M. L. THORNBERRY 
F. H. LUMPKIN 
M. F. STONE 
EARL ALDERSON 
DALE HILL 
U. J. BOSTON 
C. S. SEWARD 
C. C. POWELL 
GUY WRIGHT
B. H. HAMBRICK 
H. M. BREEDLOVE 
W. E. BENTLEY
C. B. MORRIS 
MRS. C. B. MORRIS 
C. REED SMITH 
MRS. REED SMITH 
O. W. ELLIOTT
J. R. THOMAS Jr. 
W. M. PAYNE

HOMER ESTLACK 
LON RUNDELL 
ELBERT G. HORTON 
FRANK WHITE Jr.
CARL J. SAYE
F. E. CHAMBERLAIN
REV. CHARLEY B. ROBINSON
WESLEY KNORPP
W. CARROLL KNORPP
A. M. TAYLOR
WILLARD HUDSON
H. B. PARSON
H. B. LAMKIN Jr.
GEORGE SCHOLLENBARGER 
RAY J. NOBLITT
E. H. NOLAND 
J. D. COIN 
GEO. B. BAGBY 
NELSON ANDERSON 
W. B. SMITH
A. J. EMMONS 

1 SKELTON'S DRUG
F. J. HOMMEL 
J. C. BUTLER 
Dr. T. H- ELLIS 
Dr. H. R. BECK 
Dr. K. S. LOWELL

Dr. L. A. LOWELL 
VIOLET L. COX 
CLYDE J. DOUGLAS 
JOE GOLDSTON 
R. S. BRUMLEY 
W. M. PATMAN 
J. T. PATMAN 
BRYAN CLOTHING CO.

PAUL0  HOLLINGSWORTH 
J. C. ESTLACK 
SHELBY C. BELL Jr.
WILLIAM S. GREENE 
FRANK THOMAS 
GEO. THOMPSON Jr.
L. E. THOMPSON
W. W. NOBLET
CHESTER VAUGHN
J. W. MURPtfY
WENDELL SMITH
CLARENDON RADIO SERVICE
G. C. HEATH
J. O. DESHAZO
L. D. HALL
U. Z. PATTERSON
RALPH KEYS
C. F. GARMAN

LEE BELL 
THOMAS SWINT 
C. W. BENNETT Jr. 
JOHNNIE TUCKER 
OLIN BAIN 
LEO PAULK 
B. W. HEAD 
ROY CRUTCHFIELD 
L. L. WALLACE 
JACK EDDINGS 
JOHN F. BLOCKER Jr.
S. W. LOWE 
HARRY W. DODSON 
SIMMONS POWELL 
RUTH M. RICHERSON 
CLEO WOODS 
THOMAS M. ROBERTS 
HOMER BONES 
CHARLIE BARNETT 
HOUSEHOLD SUPPLY CO. 
K. CHAMBERLAIN 
CLYDE WILSON 
W. D. SCOTT 
W. E. GOODMAN 
A. J. PARKER 
J. D. BORDEN 
RAYBURN L. SMITH

B. L. GRAHAM
R. O. MABERY 
J. R. PORTER
S. W. ENDSLEY 
EARNEST TAYLOR 
A. D. ESTLACK
G. W. ESTLACK 
FLETCHER CURRY 
MERL J. CHENAULT
E. P. SHELTON 
ALVIN LANDERS 
R. C. BRYAN 
JIMMIE CHILTON 
MAJOR HUDSON 
CARL ALLMOND
F. PHELAN 
HOWARD STEWART 
CLYDE BARKER
J. F. CLAUNCH 
M. E. KING 
W. C. MOONEY 
JOHN SEMRAD 
JOHN RHEA 
CLYDE G. MARTIN 
WILL JOHNSON 
SNOOKS ANDIS 
W. E. CLIFFORD

l
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G O L D S T O N
By Wilma Smith

♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

Mr. and Mrs. John D. Gray 
spent Thursday with her par­
ents. Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Gibbs.

Mr. and Mrs. H. M. Stewart, 
Mr. and Mrs. Neely Hudson and 
Ralph Stewart visited in the 
homes of Mr. and Mrs. Roy Stew 
art and Mr. and Mrs. Dick Eichel- 
berger awhile Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Riley and 
Miss June Brock spent Thursday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Roy Brock.

Mr. and Mrs: Jack Gray and 
son spent Thursday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Leonard Putman and fam­
ily.

Mr..and Mrs. Leonard Dozier 
vi.site^dAr. and Mrs. Roy Rober­
son awhile Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Eichelberger 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Roy Stewart 
uwfkile Wednesday night.

Carolyn McDonald spent Tues­
day night with Sue Talley.

Mrs. H. C. Smith visited Mrs.

Mrs. Houston McDonald and 
Carolyn spent the weekend visit­
ing relatives in Wichita Falls.

Carolyn McBraycr spent Sun­
day with Wilma Smith.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Stewart vis­
ited Mr. and Mrs. S. O. Philley 
Sunday evening.

Sue Taliey spent Sunday with 
Mable Dean Brock.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Stewart 
and family visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Roy Stewart and sons awhile Fri­
day night.

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Littlefield 
and Mrs. Bill Littlefield spent 
Friday in Amarillo.

Weldon Talley spent Sunday 
with Harold McDonald.

Miss Della Brock spent the 
weekend in the H. C. Smith 
home.

Bobby Blanks spent the Thanks 
giving holidays with his grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Goldston.

Mr. and Mrs. Ned Scaff, Mr. 
John Hatley of Brice and Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Goldston visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Mode Hatley, Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Putman 
and family spent Sunday in Hud 
gins

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Jacobs andVirgil Littlefield Wed. evening.
Mrs. Colla r Brock and family .

y » 7 h»  r k‘ nV p ‘ L Mr Putman Sunday evening.
M"  ’ v ^ T r h u r s  Duane Littlefield spent SundayMrs. Wilson Gray spent Thurs- wj(h , „  MrBrayer.
day with Mr. and Mrs Bones. * Putman spcnt Sunday

Mr. and Mrs Murl Lemons and with Mr. and
family of Brico spent Sunday ' * •
with Mr. and Mrs. John Lemons j Mrs- Jack ' y ' 
and family. ^nry and Lrldon McBraycr

Mr and Mrs. Odell M cBraycr spent Sunday night with Kenneth
and family spent Sunday with | and Doyi Ray Littlefield.
Mr. and Mrs. Doc Ford and sons. I ---- —------------------------

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Eichelberger I Approximately 85 per cent of 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Tul-lthe veterans receiving self-em- 
ley Sunday evening. I ployment allowances from Veter-

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Littlefield j ans Administration are farmers.
and Lloyd Edward Littlefield I -------------------------------
visited Mr. and Mrs. Tims of Select children’s toys with a 
Martin Sunday evening. | Safety Claus in mind.

Advertisem ent

Rom where 1 sit... Joe Marsh,

How to 
Stop Worrying

folks la oar tow* do about bow " oftor dinner, and gets his 
no mod| worrying aa In yeure—over worrying over in one concentrated 
W w tnc and prleea, and evopa, and period. When that’s over, he relaxee

over a friendly |Um  of beer with
~____ and they talk abent

s W *  \W>4 to toe ~ , nn til bed-

formula for stopping worry. About 
every problem, he asks himself: Is 
there anything I can do about itf 
I f there is, he neve: 
making a decision, or taking i

where I sit, that's as work 
Shi* a formula as you could And. . .  
right town to the mellow glass of 

to wink away yourbear that

sary action.
If there lent anything be can to  

about It, he seta aaide a “worrying ^oe
Copyright, 1946, United States Brewers Foundation
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CREDIT
?  ?  i

It's simply faith - • - tha faith folka hava that 

you'll pay your obligations promptly. Guard it 

ilk* a pracioua JawaL Ones lost it takas yoars to 
racovar. Once gained. it makaa tha baat friand 
you'll over have.

If bills are owalng. you can wipo tha alato 

daan with a bank loan and rapay us by tha month. 
Baat of all - - - you kaap your cradit good.

FtONLEY COUNTV
STATE BANK I

fe d e ra l D eposit CorpnraHsu

When you select distinc­
tive, fine furniture for 
Christmas gifts, you’re 
w i s e  in choosing our 
“things - for - the - home.” 
All combine comfort and 
good taste to give you
practical happiness, to o -

>
and for only a moderate 
sum.

Buy Your Gtfts for 
the Home NOW * - - 
we will set them 
back for you.

Choose either glass tap solid wal­

nut coffee table, or attractive 

hardwood telephone set.

LARG E ASSORTM ENT 
LIVING ROOM 

FURNITURE

Such lamps as 
these make 
wonderful gifts 
for her.

In every size, 
style and color.

Large assortment 
BED ROOM  

FURNITURE 
and other 

occasional places.
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CEDAR CHEST with M lf- 
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* LIBRARY NOTES *
♦ By Mrs. C. A. Burton ♦

M «
As you plan your Christmas 

giving, remember the library. 
Books you have read and enjoy­
ed would add to the pleasure of 
some one else. Many of our splen­
did books have been gifts. Will 
you add to them?

Mrs. Arther Dayis recently 
brought us an armful of books

including one mystery, one book 
for boys, one book of poems by 
Texas writers, compiled by John 
L. McCarty, and a book by A. J. 
Cronin, “The Stars Look Down.”

Mrs. Roy Beverly sent us an­
other armful of Mother Beverly’s 
books including some volumes of 
George Elliott and other stand­
ard authors, and a volume each 
of ‘ ‘Life of Moody” and “Life of 
Sam Jones.”

Arthur Morrison Wood fought 
on Bataan and Corregidor and

The Makers of Scarce
\T

Items Ask the Buying 
Public to “Try Again”

If your Local Distributor for

The Dallas Morning News
CAN'T DELIVER A PAPER  

TO YOU

OR ACCEPT A SUBSCRIPTION  
BY MAIL

Ask him to send your name to us.
We are compiling a list of names 
to be given preference when more 

• Newsprint is available.

Rate by Mail or Local Delivery 
$1.45 per Month.

THANK YOU!

THE DALLAS MORNING NEWS.

died in a Japanese prison camp 
in July 1942. While there he 
wrote a book and it was shipped 
by chance in a soldier’s footlock- 
er on one of the last transports to 
leave Corregidor. By devious 
route it finally reached Crowell 
Publishing Co. and has just been 
printed—“The Devil Is a Lonely 
Man”. It is not a war story, but a 
novel of California.

The Library of Congress has 
just acquired copies of the first 
editions of John Bunyan’s "The 
Pilgrim’s Progress,” printed in 
London in 1678. This classic 
stands unrivaled as the most 
popular and most frequently 
translated book originally writ­
ten in English—and written while 
Bunyan was in jail.

New needles which make the 
use of talking book machines 
1,500 easier will be distributed to 
25,000 blind users in this country.

The Hebrew Bible has been 
prepared in Braille by the Jewish 
Braille Institute of America.

George Sandborg, author of 
“Opportunity in Alaska,” has just 
been appointed General Manager 
of the Alaska Development 
Board. He did much of the pre­
paratory work for the recent vote 
taken in the Territory on the 
question of statehood for Alaska.

Helen Hayes played for three 
years in New York in “Victoria 
Regina”—which we have on our 
sehlves.

Ilsa Chase, 38 years old author, 
actress and lecturer, plans to 
marry Dr. Norton S. Brown, New 
York City physician and war­
time Navy Commander. She is 
the author of “Past Imperfect,” 
“ In Bed We Cry,” and many 
other semi-humorous stories.

Forty-six nations now have 
approved Louis Dolivet’s book, 
“The United Nations.”

As soon as he recovers from a 
recent fall George Bernard Shaw* 
will return to Ireland with Gab-
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riel Pascal to help set up a film 
industry near Dublin. It will be 
remembered that Shaw was 90 
years old not long ago.

Thornton Wilder is finishing a 
book at his Connccticuit home, 
and then will complete the first 
of his new plays, which Arthur 
Hopkins will direct.

Margaret Mitchell, author of 
“Gone With the Wind,” headed 
the line of buyers for Governor 
Arnall’s new* book, "The Shore 
Dimly Seen,” when it went on 
sale in Atlanta, Ga. recently— 
and purchased the first copy.

We are often reminded that 
the Bable is the best seller in the 
world—and now the Gospel of 
St. John has just been published 
in Ancash Qucchua — the first 
publication of any kind in that 
language. There are 300,000 peo­
ple who speak this language in 
northern Peru.

The Gospel of John has also 
been recently reprinted in Maya, 
in Yucatan, Mexico. This transla­
tion had been printed some years 
ago, but had been lost. This is a 
new translation.

Charles Jackson, author of 
“Lost Week-end” and “ Fall of 
Valor” has completed the first 
part of his next novel, which he 
calls “A Murder Story.”

Although British book publish­
ers have refused to buy the Brit­
ish rights to Elliott Roosevelt’s 
book, "As He Saw It,” it will be 
syndicated in the press there by 
Renoldtf. The book now is pub­
lished in 14 languages.

Ralph Ingersoll, whose post­
war book crcatedc quite a sensa­
tion, has started a lecture tour 
after which he plans to return to 
his Connecticut farm and write 
a series of novels.

We do not vouch for this, but it 
may be true— “The U. S. Army 
has purchased 2,000 copies of 
David Stern’s fantasy, “Francis,” 
the story of the talking army
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mule that advised a young lieu­
tenant on how to behave.

Mrs. Fred Chamberlain brot us 
The World, the Flesh and Father 

Smith" by Bruce Marshall, which 
we have long wanted.

SOCIAL SECURITY NEWS
In August, 1946, the Social Se­

curity Act was amended to pro­
vide for payments, in some cases, 
to survivors of deceased World 
War II veterans. This legislation 
simply provided that if a veteran 
died within 3 years of the date of 
his discharge, his survivors would 
be entitled to Old-Age and Sur­
vivors Insurance payments if 
they were not receiving, or not 
entitled to receive, Veterans Ad­
ministration payments.

To illustrate the nature and im­
portance of these payments, the 
following example is stated. The 
veteran in this case was never en­
gaged in employment covered by 
the Social Security Act, having 
worked as a farmer before his 
military service. After his dis­
charge he went into business for 
himself, and was accidentally 
killed some months afterward. 
Upon filing application recently, 
his widow qualified for monthly 
payments for hertelf of $24.18, 
with monthly payments for a 4 
year old child of $16.12, and the 
same for a 2 year old child. The 
total payments in this case, retro­
active to the month of the veter­
an’s death, amount to $56.42 a 
month, and will be payable until 
the oldest child is 18 years of age. 
For the next two years the pay­
ments to the widow and younger 
child will amount to $40.40 per 
month, with the widow entitled 
to a monthly payment of $24.18 
from age 65 to death unless she 
remarries. Total payments in this 
case, exclusively of payments to 
the widow after she is 65, will 
amount to approximately $10,500.

'r>;* l *  >

i ’

Though price ceilings 
have been removed 
we have not raised 
the wholesale price 

of Coca-Cola
Memphis Coca-Cola Bottling Co

k*

»

J. R. Sanderson, manager of 
the Amarillo Social Security 
Field Office, urges the survivors 
of deceased World War II veter­
ans to contact his office if they 
believe payments under the new 
legislation may be possible. He 
points out,- particularly, that 
prompt inquiries should be made 
because after February 10, 1947,
these payments cannot be retro­
active for more than the usual 
3 months. Before that date pay­
ments are retroactive for more 
than the usual 3 months. Before 
that date payments are retro­
active to the date of death, even 
if death occurred as far back as 
the latter part of 1940.

Veterans Administration isNop- 
erating 24 former Army and 
Navy hospitals to meet the grow­
ing need for hospital space.

Signs Ignored
America apparently doesn’t be­

lieve in signs, because 37 per cent 
of the 1945 motor vehicle-grade 
crossing accidents were at cross­
ings protected by gdteli, * lights, 
bells or watchman. Deaths from 
motor vehicle grade crossing ac­
cidents totaled 1739 in 1945 an . 1 • *
increase of 4 per cent ovqr 1944, 
the National Safety Council , re­
ports. _> , ,

The trains were traveling less 
than 30 miles an hour or standing 
still in 53 per cent of the acci­
dents.

December is one of the two 
deadliest months of the year for 
accidental deaths, the National 
Safety Council says. Peak traffic 
deaths, burns and asphyxiations 
swell the toll. , .

Donley County Consumers 
Frozen Food Lockers 
To Be In Operation Soon

The supply of boxes are limited so we urge you 
to sign up at the Consumer Service Station right 
away for your own individual needs.

Drawer Type Boxes .....................  $15.00 per year

Door Type B o x e s ...........................$12.50 per year

WE WILL FEATURE—

Complete service in the killing and curing of all 
livestock and poultry as well as quick freezing of 
fruits and vegetables and any other items to be 
placed in locker boxes.

STOCKHOLDERS—You who h>vo not rocoWod you* 
Stock CortificatM may gat them at tha Conaumar Sar- 
vica Station from Thad Rodger*.

*■> p'.mi-t ■**' r <<**!• > * + nib : « ' '

-
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T h is  is the story o f a blighted 
romance. These Swiss sweethearts 
have come to the parting of the 
ways. He keeps on climbing UP. 
She keeps on com ing D O W N . 
Only a while ago they started out 
together, hand-in-hand.

This is also the story of your 
cost of living. It has been climb­
ing steadily. Department of Labor 
statistics show tnat it has gone up 
31% since 1939.

But wait a minute! National 
average figures show that the cost 
o f electricity has actually been 
coming downward. Since 1939—  
through years o f war and short­
ages, rising prices and higher taxes 
— the cost o f  electricity has de­
creased 14%!

Actually, the average American 
family is now getting tw ice as 
much electricity for its money as it 
did 20 years ago. Never has elec­
tricity done so much for so little.

Your friends and neighbors in 
this company— under sound busi­
ness management —  made this 
possible.

W estlexas U tilities Company H"
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Jwarned you shout those Inferior Oi/s-next
time try -Phillips 66 Motor O il!"

/r - L ,f i

PROVKO BY 66 BILLION MILES OF SATISFACTORY SERVICE

♦
♦
♦
*
♦

M I D W A Y
Mrs. John Goldston

+ + ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ + ♦ ♦ ♦
Pete Riley visited Kennedy 

Davis Sunday.
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Chamber­

lain and boys of Memphis visited 
with their mothers, and in the 
home of Mr. and Mi's. Will Cham­
berlain Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. J. V. Lamberson 
of Pampa visited relatives here 
over the past week end.

Clarence Davis who is station­
ed now at Canadian in connection 
with the government Game Pre­
serve, visited with his wife who 
is staying with her parents, the 
Thornbm ys, at present, and his 
parents and family, Tuesday.

Mrs. Davis received a message 
that her sisterinlaw, Mrs. Mollie

• ♦ Riley, had returned to her home
♦ from the Clinic, but was not do
♦ ing so well and was taken back
♦ to the Clinic at Shuttuck, Okla
♦ Mr. Clifford Davis and Mr
♦ Loyce Davis of Amarillo left last 

Wednesday on a deer hunt in 
Mason County. They are expect­
ed in here this Thanksgiving.

A new windmill and tower is 
being put up on the Goldston 
farm, also one on the Mrs. Cham­
berlain ranch.

John Howard Gilbert was out 
at the Goldston farm Wednesday 
seeing to his interest on the farm. 
John had just returned from a 
deer hunt out in northern New 
Mexico. He returned with two 
large deer. He was accompanied 
by his wife, brotherinlaw and 
wife. Mr. Gilbert has purchased 
a fine high bred male to head his 
herd of thoro-bred cattle.

Mr. Hawley returned this week 
from Colorado where he purchas­

ed a number pf high bred dairy 
cows.

Mr. Vaught had a car wreck 
this past week near Wichita 
Falls. His car was damaged to the 
extent that he purchased a new 
car. Fortunately no one was hurt.

Mr. and Mrs. L. L. Taylor vis­
ited in the W. K. Davis home 
Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. LaVern Goldston 
of McLean brought their son 
Jimmy back to the hospital for a 
check up after an appendectomy 
last Tuesday. They were dinner 
guest in the home of Mrs. Gold- 
ston’s brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
Harlis McMahan, and visited in 
the home of LaVern’s mother in 
the afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Riley vis­
ited with the W. K. Davis’ Sun.

Mrs. Will Chamberlain visited 
her mother, Mrs. Rhode, Tuesday 
and visited with Mrs. John 
Chamberiain and Mrs. Hardin in
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the afternoon.
Mr. Vaughn, was in Clarendon 

on business Monday.
Vernon Goldston and Clyde 

Price of Clarendon spent Thurs­
day with Edward Sawyer.

Mr. and Mrs. Hawley and dau­
ghters Marguerite Ann and Eddie 
Louise spent Thanksgiving with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Vaughn

Betsy Chamberlain was ill the 
past week.

Mr. and Mrs. Stevenson and 
daughter Jaunelle went to Ama­
rillo Friday. They visited also 
with Mrs. Tomlinson, and she re­
turned home with them for a 
visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Loyce Davis and 
children of Amarillo spent the 
weekend in the W. K. Davis 
home.

John Howard Gilbert is putting 
up the new windmill and tower 
on the Goldston farm.

Mr. and Mrs. John F. Harlan 
of Amarillo were down Sunday. 
They visited with her parents, the 
Scotts and John F. took advant­
age of the 1st day of season for 
quail hunting.

Brack LaGrone and Ernest 
Lamberson were also out this 
way hunting Sunday.

Those to enjoy Thanksgiving 
dinner in the Will Chamberlain 
home Thursday were Mr. and 
Mrs. Miller, Mrs. John Chamber- 
lain and Mrs. Rhode, all of Clar­
endon.

Guests in the Goldston home 
Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. Nolie 
Simmons, Mrs. Hardin, Mrs. 
Chamberlain and Mr. and Mrs. |
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Gene Chamberlain and boys of 
Memphis.

Mrs. Moreland visited with her 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Cannon at Martin last Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Jones 
were guest in the Ben Chamber- 
lain home at Claude Sunday.

Mrs. Marvin Jones was called 
into town Thursday morning on 
account of the illness of her fath­
er, Mr. Rhodes who was serious­
ly ill. He is some better at pres­
ent, but is to go to Memphis hos­
pital this Tuesday for X-rays.

Mrs. Jones of Clarendon took 
Thanksgiving dinner with her 
son, Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Jones.

every unfortunate victim in Tex­
as to mail their contributions di­
rect to State Headquarters, Dris- 
kill Hotel, Austin, Texas, and that 
the contributions received thru 
the mail would be credited to the

quota of the county from which 
such contributions were received.

!rs. C. E. Griggs is spending 
two \yeeks with relatives in Nor­
man, Okla.

TEXAS GOING OYER 
IN  KENNY CAMPAIGN

AUSTIN — Early reports on 
progress of the Sister Elizabeth 
Kenny Campaign in Texas shows 
the state going over the top in 
raising its $150,00 quota, it was 
announced here today by George 
C. Francisco, Jr., of Houston, 
Chairman of the Texas Executive 
Committee, Sister Elizabeth Ken­
ny Infantile Paralysis Founda­
tion. Campaigns in more than 150 
Tejjas counties will come to an 
end Saturday, Dec. 7. In the 
counties where no organized 
campaign is underway, Mr. Fran­
cisco said that the committee had 
resorted to asking for contribu­
tions by mail.

The Texas committee urged 
anyone who was interested in 
seeing the Kenny method of 
treating polio made available to

Product of 17/000
Inventions

More than 17,000 inventions have 
helped American telephone service 
gain world leadership. Much of this 
telephone progress has been pio­
neered by the United States Inde­
pendent Telephone Industry. This 
company is proud to belong to this 
progressive gre up of more than 6000 
locally - operated companies.

SOUTHWESTERN ASSOCIATED 
TELEPHONE CO.

Pre-Inventory SALE
SELECT PRACTICAL XMAS GIFTS - - - - AND SAVE MONEY

You Save from 15% to 30%
SELECT YOUR COLD WEATHER CLOTHING NEEDS NOW and SAVE

Just a Few Gift Suggestions 
from BROOK’S to assist 
you with your shopping

For the ladies we suggest such items as 
Chenille and Chints Bed Spreads, Shag Rugs, 
Wool Comforts. Wool Blankets. Towels, 
Lingerie. Robes. Kid and fabric gloves, 
purses, and costume Jewelry.

For the children we suggest Robes. 
Sweaters. Toboggans. Jackets, Belts. Sox 
and Gloves.
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For the gentlemen we offer 

a nice selection of Robes, 

sport shirts, socks, ties; all 

kinds of jackets, gloves, hats, 

pajamas, shorts & shirts, wool 

scarfs, belts & tie sets.

Brooks Dry Goods
THE QUALITY STORE

Mens Leather and 

Leather Trim

Jackets &. Coats
JACKETS

$8.69 $10.95 $13.50

Coats - - Si7.95 $19.95

MENS WOOL

MACKINAWS 
& JACKETS 
$5.90 $11.95

Boys Leather and 
Laather Trim

JACKETS
Ages 4 to 16

$5.89 $7.95 $9.65 $12.75

BOYS

MACKINAWS 
& JACKETS

Ages 4 to 16

$1.98 $3.98 $6.35 $8.95

Corduroy Jackets
Small Boys

$2.98 $3.98

USE OUR 

LAY - AWAY 

PLAN

MENS KHAKI PANTS

$2.69 $2.89 $2.98
W HIP CORD PANTS

$2.29 $1.98
ARMY CLOTH PANTS

$3.29 $3.79

BOYS KHAKI PANTS
6 to 16

$1.98 $2.33
SCHOOL AND  DRESS PANTS

6 to 16
$198 $2.19 $2.39

BLANKETS
COTTON 

50% WOOL 
25% WOOL 
Solid Colors 

Plaids

MENS
KHAKI SHIRTS 

ARMY CLOTH SHIRTS 
CHAMBRY AND 

POPLIN SHIRTS 
COTTON and 

FLANNEL SHIRTS

BOYS
KHAKI SHIRTS 

School and Dress Shirts 
6 to 14

$1.39 $1.69 $1.98
BOYS PLAID SHIRTS 

Reds and Blues
• to 12
$1.58

WOMEN and GIRLS 

DRESSES 

SWEATERS
PANTIES#
SLIPS

SCARFS

MENS and BOYS  

3 and 4 Buckle

OVERSHOES

HOUSE SHOES

LADIES and MISSES

Overshoes and Galoshes

HOUSE SHOES

SHOP OUR HARDW ARE DEPARTMENT t FOR USEFUL. PRACTICAL GIFTS and TOYS for the little folks.

■ I  NOBLITT SALES CO.
"FARM AN D  HOME SUPPLIES"

BUTANE GAS —  CLOTHING  —  SHOES —  HARDWARE
GENERAL ELECTRIC APPLIANCES —  OLIVER FARM EQUIPMENT
77 Phone 77


