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Livestock Market Hits 
All Time High Mark

Mrs. C. A. Burton 
Resigns Red Cross 
Service Post

Carnival 
V ie  For

Queen Candidates To 
Coronation Honors

Livestock traders smashed the 
highest cattle prices on record 
to smithereens Wednesday in one 
of the wildest sessions the stock- 
yards ever saw, forced hog price* 
up to the new record level estab­
lished Tuesday, and indicated 
Tuesday's record price on lambs 
would be well-broken before the 
day's trading ended.

From all over the nation came 
reports of much higher receipts 
of livestock than were anticipat­
ed over night. Despite the in­
creasing flood of truck-borne 
herds to terminal markets, the 
demand was still much greater 
than the supply.

In consequence fed steers at 
Chicago hit $35.25 a hundred 
pounds, far above the $30.25 rec­
ord set Aug. 30. Hogs again sold 
at $27.50. the new peak reached 
Tuesday, although later sales 
weakened to around $26 as buy­
ers could not find facilities to 
move out their purchases. Lambs 
were being held for higher than 
the best bid price of $26.50. com­
pared with the record set Tues­
day at $25.

Now, if you have gotten your 
wind back and are not suffering 
too severely, keep reading on and 
take a look at the Southwest 
market last week. Ah, me, those 
good old days of last week may 
be something to dream about 
from now on.
Cotton turned downward from 
its peak, but grains climbed high­
er and livestock, poultry, eggs 
and other farm products remain­
ed steady to stronger at moat 
southwest markets last week, 
USDA’s Production and Market­
ing Administration reported to­
day.

Strong cotton prices last week 
almost reached 39-cents, but later 
receded, and the close was ir­
regular. Most southwest farmers 
continued to sell their cotton as 
soon as it was ginned, but the 
lower basis caused a slight hold­
ing tendency after mid-week. De­
mand appeared a little less ag­
gressive, but absorbed all offer­
ings. About 27 percent of the esti­
mated production of 8,724,000

bales was ginned through Sep­
tember, with quality above a 
year ago. However, rains in 
Tex&s, Oklahoma and New Mex­
ico damaged open cotton and re­
tarded harvest operations.

Cloudy and wet weather inter- 
ferred with peanut digging last 
week. Prices held steudy at the 
loan-support level. Demand for 
shelled stock tvas light.

Rice harvest made good pro­
gress in Texas, Louisiana and 
Arkansas last week.^ Milled rice 
markets became more active as 
shipments of new rice increased. 
Prices held steady at OPA maxi­
mum levels with supplies far be­
low demand. Other grains were 
in good demand too, and higher. 
Sorghums gained 30 cents a cwt„ 
corn 5 cents a bu., oats 4 cents, 
wheat 3 cents and barley 2 rents. 
Scant offerings of feed coupled 
with urgent demand kept prices 
firm. Farmers in many instances 
traded their cottonseed for meal. 
Hay held steudy with demand 
active for good quality alfalfa.

Southwest fruits and vegeta­
bles brought steady to higher 
prices last week, at most shipping 
points and consumer markets. 
Colorado reported light haulings 
of onions and potatoes due to wet 
fields helped strengthen prices. 
Sweet Spanish onions brought 65 
to 85 cents a 50-lb. sack, depend­
ing on size, and washed dark Red 
McClure potatoes $1.85 to $1.90 
a 100-lb. sack. Louisiana sweet 
potatoes were up 10 to 20 cents u 
bushel over the previous week’s 
close at $2.50 for U. S. No. 1 
Porto Ricans. Even at this price 
most haulings were going into 
storage. New Mexico and Arkan­
sas apples held steady.

Demand remained good* for 
light egg and poultry supplies 
and prices firm. Dealers reported 
higher prices were discouraging 
some buyers. Current , receipt 
eggs ranged from 40 to 46 cents- 
a dozen. Heavy hens generally 
brought 27 to 33 cents a lb. except 
at New Orleans where they rang­
ed from 37 to 41 cents.

Southwest hog markets receiv­

ed 5075 head this past week com­
pared to 4810 of the previous 
week. A ll offerings held steady 
at ceiling.

Small sheep and lamb supplies 
sold quickly at steady to stronger 
prices last week at most south­
west markets.

Mostly stockers and feeders 
showed up at southwest cattle 
markets last week. Scant supplies 
of slaughter cattle held steady, 
but other classes tended ,wcak. 
Common and medium steers and 
yearlings brought $11.50 to 
$14.50, Houston; $13.50 to $16, 
San Antonio and $12 to $17, Ft. 
Worth. Stocker and feeder steers 
realized $14.50 to $16.75, Okla­
homa City; $14 to $16. Wichita 
and $13 to $17.50, Denvei*.

LOCAL GRO CERYM AN  
PH EASAN T H UN TIN G  
IN  SOUTH DAKOTA

Joining a group of hunters 
from Amarillo and other Pan­
handle points, W. E. (B ill) Ray 
left Sunday morning for a week’s 
pheasant hunt in South Dakota 
where it has been reported that 
there was a bountiful supply of 
the colorful game bird.

Mr. Ray wired his wife Wed­
nesday afternoon stating that 
they were having very good luck. 
Mr. Ray will probably return 
home around the first of next 
week with some of those first 
class hunting yams as this is his 
first experience at pheasant 
hunting and his first vacation in 
a long, long time.

JOHNNY LEATHERS MAKES 
TECH JUDGING TEAM

Johnny E. Leathers, son of Mr, 
and Mrs. D. E. Leathers, notified 
his parents the first of the week 
that he had made the Lubbock 
Tech Livestock Judging Team, 
and would go with the team to 
the Kansas City Royal this week. 
Johnnie has made the team since 
reintoring the school 30 days ago. 
and has taken up where he left 
o ff four years ago to serve with 
the Navy and Marines.

Editors Note: The following * 
article below is self explanatory 
but we wish to add just a little 
to what Mrs. Burton has written 
for her regular column.

It is not every day that you 
find a person who would hold 
down a non-paying job for such 
a long period of time. She has 
always been willing to render her 
services whenever there was a 
need. There arc a large number 
of persons for whom she has ren­
dered her services through the. 
Red Cross, and we know that 
within their hearts there is a 
place of gratitude. She has done 
a very splendid job all through 
the years and should receive the 
thanks of our entire citizenry.

Mrs. Burton has turned the job 
over to Miss Ruth Richerson and 
we know she, too, will always 
give her best as Home Service 
Chairman.

l  RED CROSS l
♦  VOLUNTEER SERVICE ♦
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

' i
By Mrs. C. A. Burton

Miss Ruth Richerson is taking 
my place as Home Service Chair­
man of the Donley County Chap­
ter of Red Cross. Miss Richerson 
is County School Superintendent, 
with her office in the Court 
House, so can easily be reached, 
and will capably care for all the 
needs of the soldiers, ex-soldiers, 
and their families.

I have had this Home Service 
work for 29 years, through two 
wars. I have loved the work and 
have been glad to help in this 
way. It has been volunteer ser­
vice— no Red Cross worker in 
Donley County has ever received 
any salary.

I have gladly tried to take care 
of my. people— but now I feel 
that it is wise for me to give û > 
the work— and I send you to Miss 
Richerson.

Mrs. J. B. McClelland 
To Be Buried Here 
Sunday At 2:30 p. m.

Girl Scout Week LOCAL UN ITED  COUNCIL 
OF CHURCH WOMEN  
IN V ITED  TO A M A R ILLO

The United Council of Church 
Women of Clarendon have been 
invited to be the guests of The 
United Council of Church Wom­
en of Amarillo, November 1st, at 
10:00 A. M. The meeting will*be 
at the Polk Street Methodist 
Church, with a covered dish 
luncheon. The lesson Study 
Theme is: “ World Peace.”

Remember this date— Nov. 1st.

Oct. 28— Nov. 3 will he observed 
as Girl Sqout Week by more than 
a million wearers of the gray- 
green Girl Scout uniform. “Cit­
izenship in Action Around the 
World” is the theme of the Week.

SOIL CO NSERVATION  
BOARD TO M EET

The board of supervisors of the 
Donley county soil conservation 
board will meet in the office of 
the county agent, H. M. Breed­
love, October 22nd at 1:30 p. m. 
J. R. Porter, chairman of the 
board is calling the meeting so 
that information on the district 
can be compiled and submitted to 
Washington for a charter. The 
board has been working on this 
program for several months and 
practically all information neces­
sary has been secured to com 
plete the project.

ABSENTEE VOTING 
OPENS IN COUNTY

Absentee voting for the general 
election .opened Wednesday, Oc­
tober 16. and all persons wishing 
to vote in this manner should ap­
ply to the county clerk for a bal­
lot.

Absentee voting will continue 
through November 1, and the 
general election will follow on 
Tuesday, November 5.

Mias Carrie Davis returned 
home Sunday from a weeks visit 
with her mother in Ok la.

The candidates for the Carnival 
Queen who is to be crowned at 
the Hallowe’en Carnival at Jr. 
High School Hallowe’en night. 
Oct. 31, were elected by their 
respective grades Tuesday after­
noon.

The girls elected and their es­
corts are as follows:

College: Sophomore — Sylvia 
Fox; Freshman— Erie Etta Can­
non. ,

12th grade: Naomi Mooring— 
Lynn Leathers.

11th grade: Juanita Carpenter 
—Wayne Lowe.

10th grade: Ira Jean Estlack— 
Joe Wayne Dilli.

9th grade: Billy Doris Tims—  
Bobby Whitaker.

8th grade: Fanchon Allred— 
Wilson Lane.

7th grade: June Star Allred— 
Jerry Price.

6th grade:' Patricia Estlack—Jo 
Len Ballew.

5th grade: Cynthia Ann Thorn- 
berry—Bobby Parker.

4th grade: Rebecca King—Glen 
Wallace.

3rd grade: Jacqueline Marie 
Estlack—Tommy Lane.

2nd grade: Mary Frances Mc- 
Cully—Gene Alderson.
1st grade: Lorna Dee Underdown 
—Jack Terry Robinson.

Train Bearers for the corona­
tion will be Judy Thompson and 
Glendi Mooney and Crown Bear­
er w ill be Gene Elmore.

tizers served from 6:00 o’clock on, l Votes for these candidates w ill 
thus making it possible for you\be lc Per vote- The money w ill go 
to come earty, have dinner and ] to ^•T.A. who is sponsoring
then indulge in the various gam- j Carnival. Boxes and pictures 
es. Bingo! Grab bags, white o le -I ° t  girls have been placed in 
phant sale, auctioneering and so a number of business firms. Your 
many things that you can really I vo*e f° r your choice of queen will 
enjoy including a Chamber of I appreciated by the girls and 
Horrors!! Spooks - - I should say I thc Pa rent-Teacher Association, 
so! Fun for all!

The reason for the carnival 
that the P.T.A. is sponsoring is to 
raise money for the school cafe­
teria which is in need of equip­
ment, such as a stove. The cafe­
teria is a real asset to our schools 
and we should all support it. We 
ask that you watch for the Don­
ley County Leader next week for 
full details.

P. T. A. To Have
Hallowe’en
Carnival

By Reporter
Wow! We can all have lots of 

fun this Hallowe’en. The Parent- 
Teachers Association has arrang­
ed for a real bang up carnival 
for everyones pleasure on Hal­
lowe’en night!

Ladies, listen to this— not only 
can you and your families have 
fun playing games but there will 
also bG food to whet the appetites 
of those hungry men and children 
and you can get a much needed 
rest from the cookstove. There 
will be delicious sandwiches, 
cake, pies, drinks and other appe-

COTTON GINNING 
REPORT

According to W. M. Patman, 
Special Agent, the Census report 
shows that 177 bales of cotton 
were ginned in Donley County 
from thc crop of 1946 prior to 
October 1st as compared with 539 
bales for thc crop of 1945.

ICourtMs of St. Loaia Diapatok,
* A  # w

EMPLOY THE PHYSICALLY HANDICAPPED VETERAN.r  IT ’S GOOD. BUSINESS;

Funeral services will be held 
Sunday afternoon at 2:30 at thc 
local St. John the Baptist Episco­
pal church for Mrs. John Bruce 
McClelland with the Rev. W. 
Warrin Fry officiating.

Mrs. McClelland passed away 
at the home of her daughter in 
Scarsdale, N. Y. on February 9, 
1946. Since that date, her body 
has been lying in state in the 
Ferncliff Moslcum 8t Hartsdale, 
N. Y.

A devoted church worker, she 
wrote a brief history of St. John 
the Baptist Church, Claxerdon, 
Texas, from 1887 to 1936. The 
first service of this church in 
Donley County was held in Mrs. 
McClelland’s home, a small ranch 
near Clarendon, in November, 
1887. Thc church, built later, was 
the first Episcopal church built in 
the Panhandle of Texas.

Mrs. McClelland, was born in 
Selma, Ala., on May 5, 1863. She 
spent most of her life in Texas 
where she was a leader and or­
ganizer in the Clarendon church 
and was one of the prominent 
pioneer ranch women of this 
area.

Slie is survived by her son, 
James Bruce McClelland of 
Oklahoma City, Okla.; her dau- 

> ghtcr, Mrs. • Henry Dodge of 
Scarsdale, N. Y.; a sister. Mrs. A. 
T. Embrec of Fredericksburg, 
Va.; four grandchildren, and one 
great-grand child.

Mrs. Henry Dodge Will accom­
pany the body here and is ex­
pected to arrive in Clarendon on 
thc northbound train Friday 
evening at 8:40.

Burial , w ill be in Citizens 
Cemetery with funeral arrange­
ments under the direction of 
Murphy - Spicer - Buntin Funeral 
Home.

Mrs. M. S . Swinburne of Ash- 
tola visited Mrs. N. L. Jones Wed.

Bronchos To Meet McLean Tigers 
Here Friday Night At 8 O’clock
DONLEY STEER TAKEN TO 
AMERICAN ROYAL

Billy Thombcrry and county 
agent H. M. Breedlove left for 
Kansas City. Mo., October 16th to 
show a hereford steer belonging 
to Billy in the American Royal. 
The Lions club looked over the 
steer last Friday, after their 
luncheon at the Antro Hotel and 
hopes are high that the steer will 
bring high honors to Donley 
county.

The judging of the steers in 
Kansas City will be on thc twen­
ty first of October. This -show is 
a natjonal show and open to all 
feeders all over the country.

Irrigation Tour 
October 24-25

There is a possibility that cer­
tain types of farms in Donley 
county could be irrigated depend­
ing a great deal on the water 
supply. Mr. Grace of the soil con­
servation service will be in Don­
ley County on the 24th and 25th 
of this month to make a survey 
and assist with this program.

H. M. Breedlove, county agent; 
has arranged for Mr. Qggce’s ser­
vices and a tour will be held of 
several farms on the morning of 
the 25th. A ll farmers and busi-. 
ness men wishing to attend this |

tour will meet at the county 
agents office at nine o’clock on 
the morning of the 25th.

The Donley County Farm Bu­
reau will hold a meeting at the 
school house at Lelia Lake on 
the evening of the 24th at 7 p. m., 
and all persons in the county are 
invited to attend this meeting as 
Mr. Grace will discuss irrigation 
in Donley county.

Mr. Breedlove is requesting all 
persons to attend these two meet­
ings who are interested in irri­
gation. This is an agricultural 
project that is under considera­
tion for the first time in Donley 
and we will have to feel our way 
slowly and be sure of the results, 
Breedlove stated. This can be 
done by Careful planning and test 
walls for water before the actual 
plant is put in operation. Thc 
dates to remember are the morn­
ing of the 25th at nine o'clock at 
the county agents office for the 
tour and the evening of the 24th 
at 7 p. m. at the Lelia Lake 
school house for the Farm Bu­
reau program and a talk by Mr. 
Grace on irrigation in Donley 
County.

Mrs. Don Martin and Mrs. E. 
O. Bams visited their mother, 
Mrs. Lola Barns Sunday.

Mrs. W. A. Land, Mrs. Sam 
Lowe and Mrs. Greer Cottingham 
were Amarillo visitors Friday.

The Broncs will be in there 
pitching hard this Friday night 
against the McLean Tigers to 
make up for the defeat that was 
handid them by the Skyrockets 
in last week’s game. This is due 
to be a much better game than 
usual as it appears tbat both 
teams are more evenly matched 
outside of the line weight average 
and the Tigers hold a little edge 
there. The Tigers were picked as 
one of the weakest teams of the 
district at the first of the season, 
but have shown themselves well 
since that time, mainly by de­
feating the Memphis Cyclones 
and holding the score down when 
they were defeated by the Irish­
men from Shamrock 12-0 last 
week whert we were being 
trounced by a more experienced 
eleven from Wellington 27-0.

The Broncs have been going 
the limit this week in preparation 
for the game, and Coach Mc- 
Knight has been placing more 
emphasis on blocking than any­
thing else.

All in all this should be a very 
interesting game and our boys 
need your backing as much as 
ever even though they lost their 
game last week. That is the only 
conference game they have lost 
so far this year and the Broncs 
still have a chance to place high 
in the 3-A District play.

The time w ill be 8 p. m. Fri­
day night at the College Park, sp* 
be sure to be there.

CD
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• LIBRARY NOTES *
♦  By Mrs. C. A. Burton ♦  
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

Mrs. Coppinger of Dallas, sis­
ter to Mrs. Elba Ballew, wrote 
her sister that she would like to 
give our library several books for 
our little people in memory of 
Mrs. Fannie Ballew. The choice

was left to me, and I ordered the 
following: “Just Like Me” by 
Ruth Mac Kay; “A Farm Story,” 
Elsa Ruth Nast; “ Bobbie and 
Donnie Were Twins," “Ask Mr. 
Bear," Marjorie Flack; "The 
Brave Bantam,” Louise Seaman; 
“Billy and Blaze,” Anderson. 
They are a lovely collection of 
stories which are a fitting me­
morial to Mother Ballew, and for

which we are very grateful. 
These follow the two books by 
the C. B. Morris family, and the 
one by Irma Lewis Osborne men­
tioned last week. Flowers to our 
loved ones are a beautiful tribute, 
but so quickly they are gone, 
while a book is a tribute which 
enriches the life of everyone who 
reads it.

One of the most interesting 
perBOnalities at the Book Fair at 
Dallas last fall was Louise Bak­
er who used only one crutch to 
take the place of the lost limb—  
instead of an artificial leg she 
used the crutch. Bright, vivac­
ious, interesting, she appeared 
more than once— but she did not 
discuss her own misfortune. But 
she does do that in one of our 
latest book buys, “Out On a 
Limb.” The book is her personal 
story, and is not only one of the 
most stimulating and amusing 
books of the season, but even 
more, it will be a revelation to 
all who have at any time been 
faced with personal disaster. 
Miss Baker was “Out On a 
Limb,” but she never fell off.

Cond«ns«d Statement of the Condition of 
THE DONLEY COUNTY STATE BANK 

of Clarendon, Texas .

Officers and Directors

Wesley Knorpp, President 
F. E. Chamberlain, Executive Vice-President 

J. L. McMurtry, Vice-President W. Carroll Knorpp, Cashier
M. R. Allensworth, Assistant Vice-President Walter B. Knorpp, Assistant Cashier 

W. J. Lewis D. N. Grady C. T. McMurtry

September 30, 1946

RESOURCES

Loans & Discounts ................ $ 423,986.49
U. S. Bonds Owned .................  1,083.000.00
School Warrants .......................  2,874.54
Overdrafts ................................  2,285 55
Banking House ..........................  5,500.00
Furniture & F ix tu res ................  1.00
CASH & EXCHANGE ........... 539.995.08

LIAB ILIT IES

Capital Stock ............................  $ 50,000.00

Surplus ...................................... . 20,000.00

Undivided Profits .......................  16,791.73

Resenw? for Contingencies .........  600.00

DEPOSITS ................................ 1.970.250.93

T o ta l ............  S2.0S7.642.66 T o ta l ............  S2.057.642.66

The above statement is correct: W. Carroll Knorpp, Cashier 

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

m o s t  i m p o r t a n t  
of  all cars to y o u  a r e . . .

THE
CAR Y O U ’ RE 

DRIVING 
NOW

and your 
forthcoming

KEEP IT WELL SERV­
ICED by bringing It 
to our modem Chev­
rolet Service Head­
quarter* at regular 

interval*, and gain these * practical 
advantages: (1) safeguard your pres­
ent transportation; (2) avoid the major 
breakdowns which to often hit old 
cart In cold weather; (3) save money 
by preventing serious troubles and 
repair bills; and (4) maintain the resale 
value of your car. Remember—we're 
members of America's foremast auto­
motive service organization; and 
motorist after motorist w ill tall you; 
OUR CAR-SERVICE IS YOUR BEST 
CAR-SAVER; Coma In—fodayf

CHEVROLET

REST A SSU RED  
THAT WE'LL MAKE 
DELIVERY of your 

new Chevrolet just at quickly as we 
can; although it's impassible to give 
accurate estimates of delivery dates; 
We're getting our fair share of Chaw  
rolet's currant output, but production 
is still running far below normal, even 
though Chevrolet baft more cars and 
trucks than any o lW  tnonufxscturer during 
fha third quarter of 1946. Meanwhile; 
our sincere thanks la you far waiting 
for delivery—and our assurance that 
your patience w ill bo well rewarded 
when you take possession of this car; 
giving BIO-CAR QUALITY AT LOWEST 
COST!

CLARENDON MOTOR COMPANY

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

Another, new book is “The 
Miracle of the Bells” by Russell 
Janney. It is described as a joy­
ous novel about the four days 
when the church bells rang day 
and night in a small Pennsyl­
vania town. One reviewer says, 
“ If you liked 'The Robe,” you 
w ill certainly like this book ” 
Another says, “ It is the kindf of 
book America needs now.”

The author, Russell Janney, at 
the age of sixty-one, has turned 
novelist. He has been writing 
since his youth. More recently 
he has been a theatre producer in 
London and New York. The 
rights to publish "The Miracle of 
the Bells” in foreign editions has 
already been sold by Prentice- 
Hall to nine foreign publishers.

As the Exhibition of the Week 
in the Library of Congress is be­
ing shown the printed text of 
Columbus’ letter describing the 
islands he discovered—beginning 
on Columbus Day and continuing 
through the 18th. In March 1493, 
Columbus returning to Spain af­
ter completing his voyage of 224 
days. He announced his discov­
eries in two letters. The original 
letters were lost but both had 
been printed. Fifteen editions of 
this letter were printed before 
1500. This copy is believed to be­
long to the fourth edition— in 
Latin.

.Thursday, Octobar 17, 1946

NEWS

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to express to the 

many friends and neighbors in 
and near Clarendon and those in 
the Ashtola Community our 
gratitude for the many acts of 
kindness, the beautiful floral o f­
ferings, words of condolence ex­
pressed in the sermon and for 
the many other beautiful tributes 
to the family of Mrs. Lou Mc­
Clellan who passed away October 
7th. The friendship of all made 
our sorrow easier to bear.

I am the Way, the Truth and the 
Life; no man cometh unto the 
Father, but by me.—John 14-6.

CROSSING THE BAR 
Sunset and evening star,

And one clear call for me.
And may there be no moaning of 

the bar
When I put out to sea.

But such a tide as moving seems 
asleep,

Too full for sound or foam, 
When that which drew from out 

the boundless deep 
Turns again home.

Twilight and evening bell.
And after that the dark.

And may there be no sadness of 
farewell

When I embark;

For though from out our bourne 
of Time and Place 

The flood may bear me far,
I hope to see my Pilot face to face 

When I have crossed the bar.

Mr. and Mrs. R. H. Elkins 
Mr. and Mrs. R. K. Elkins 
Mr. and Mrs. Rex Elkins 
Dr. and Mrs. J. H. Kelley.

Nearly 5,000 veterans bought 
consumer and capital goods from 
the War Assets Administration 
amounting in cost to the govern­
ment to $9,856,307 from July 1 
through Sept. 30. July was the 
heaviest month in dollar value, 
when $6,00,000 worth of mater­
ial was sold. More veterans pur­
chased in September, but for a 
lighter dollar value.

Texas schools and colleges will 
be given top preference and bar­
gain prices in the purchase of 
surplus machine tools and class­
room laboratory equipment for 
use in training veterans enrolled 
under the GI Bill of Rights. 
W AA will sell to eligible educa­
tional buyers at a fraction of 
original cost—5% of the fair 
valye (plus shipping charges). 
Electrical and woodworking ma­
chinery, heating equipment, 
electronic devices, furniture, 
optical instruments, engineering 
instruments and apparatus are 
among the items listed for sale. 
Applications should be sent to 
the nearest Federal Works 
Agency, which, after screening 
and certification, will forwaxd 
orders to the W AA to be filled.

More than 1,500 flying jackets 
of various types are being offer­
ed for sale by WAA. Prices range 
from $2.62 to $5.98 each. The 
jackets are all used, but usable 
without repair. Minimum quanti­
ties are: To wholesalers and 
large retailers, $5,000, small re­
tailers, $200. The sale ends Oct. 
31st.

Steel airplane landing mats 
now have a new use— for conver­
sion into temporary corn storage 
cribs. A  national sale of 4 mill­
ion feet suitable for that purpose 
is located at Kanakee, III., and 
will be shipped from there to

purchasers FOB in carload lots. 
Offers to purchase from the 
Kanakee stockpile for corn stor­
age, will be considered if they 
reach the Materials and Supplies 
Sales Division, W AA, Washing­
ton 25, D. C., by Oct. 25th. For 
more information, if desired, 
write W A A  Office, T&P Bldg., 
Fort Worth.

A  fifty-million dollar stock of 
surplus capital and producers 
goods has come on the market 
through the New York regional 
office. The stock is divided a-

mong machine tools ($3,000,000 
inventory), industrial equipment, 
metals, and electrical equipment. 
The right to purchase is open to 
all buyers. Prospective purchas­
ers who have specific require­
ments for machine tool equip­
ment arc invited to submit their 
inquiries to Lee Brewer, chief, 
metal working equipment sales 
division, W AA, T&P Bldg., Fort 
Worth.

Mrs. Cal Merchant and her sis­
ter, Mrs. Roy "Carhart are in 
Dallas and Temple this week.

“ Pyorrhea” May
Follow Neglect

Didfyou ever see an attractive 
person with irritated "GUMS” ? 
Druggists refund money if first 
bottle of “ LETO'S” fails to help. 

Douglas 8c Goldston Drug Co.

"Think I'll dress and run over to the BRYAN  

CLOTHING COM PANY for a Stetson hat before 

we leave."

ALLEN J .  BRYAN , MANAGE
G  S L a J ~ v e jru d ic r r\ ,  e/SCCL/i,

Forces of Attraction 
Make theTide'Come In"...

and OllrPlATE Your Engine!
Be QuickTo Treat

CLARENDON, TEXAS

Chronic bronchitis may develop If 
your cough, chest cold, or acute bron­
chitis Is not treated and you cannot 
afford to take a chance with any medi­
cine less potent than Creomulsion 
which goes right to the seat of the 
trouble to help loosen and expel germ 
laden phlegm and aid nature' to 
soothe and heal raw, tender, lnfiameo 
bronchial mucous membranes.

Creomulsfbn blends beechwood 
creosote by special process with other 
time tested medicines for coughs. 
It  contains no narcotics.

No matter how many medicines 
you have tried, tell your druggist to 
sell you a bottle of Creomulsion with 
the understanding you must like the 
way it quickly allays the cough, per­
mitting rest and sleep, or you arc to 
have your money back. (Adv.)

FLOOR SANDING
FINISHING fc REPAIRING

Experienced with 
Ft. Worth's Largest Floor Co.

Phone 352-J for 
Earliest Date and Estimata 

or see
Foxworth - Galbraith Lbr. Co.

K. K. DAY A SONS

F o r  G o o d  In su ra n ce

KELLY
CHAMBERLAIN
A ll T yp es -—A ll K in d s

I’ROMI* 1 A DJI \S I MF.N 1 S 

< l/»r«-1 m1< >n. I ' r x n *

EVERYONE knows that tides are 
caused by the strange force of at­
traction exerted on the sea by the moon.

Utilizing molecular attraction (basic 
force that holds things together) Conoco 
scientists bring America’s motorists new 
and better oils. In fact, a special ingredi­
ent of Conoco N ,h motor oil is bonded to 
working surfaces of your engine by an at­
traction so strong that cylinder walls and 
other parts are o i l - p l a t e d .

And because molecular attraction holds 
Conoco o i l - p l a t i n g  up where it belongs 
. . .  prevents it from all draining down to 
the crankcase, even overnight. . .  you get 
these benefits:

added protection when your engine 
starts up

added protection from corrosive 
action

4
added protection from wear that 
leads to fouling sludge and carbon

added smooth, silent miles
That’s why to o i l - p l a t e  now . . .  at Your 
Conoco Mileage Merchant’s. Look for the 
red triangle. Continental Oil Company

JOHN F. BLOCKER Jr. GOODMAN &  SCOTT
YOUR LOCAL CONOCO AGENT YOUR MILEAGE MERCHANTS

Office at Warehouse Phone 35-A  4 blocks West on Highway Phone 112

e A



OUR BURIAL INSURANCE

Our Burial insurance meets all requirements. It is 
something that every member of your family 
should obtain and keep. We will be happy to ex­
plain our Burial Insurance to you, any time.

Thursday, Octobar 17. 1946.

♦ ♦
♦  THE TEMPLE OF TRUTH ♦
♦ • ♦
*  By tbs e
♦ ♦ 
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

If you want something sharper 
than Boogy-Woogy, try a musical 
saw.

♦  ♦  ♦
W E A K LY  POME.

Little Boy Blue 
Come blow your horn. 
Petrillo’s not looking 
And the cows are in the com. 

♦  ♦  4
This new-fangled “music” we 

hear over the radio meets with

the approval of a lot of folks or 
they would cut it out. Often we 
wonder if they all belong to 
Petrillo’s musician’s union, espec­
ially the kid who whams the tin 
tub with the bed slat, while the 
other racket is in progress

♦  ♦  4

Just read about a man on a 
trip around the Globe on a bi­
cycle. He evidently thinks cars 
will be available by the time he 
gets back home.

♦ 4 4

The bigger a man’s head, the 
easier it is to fill his shoes.

4 4 4

“What am I offered for this

A Feed for Every Need
A  full line of that good Chlc-O-Line—the feed that 
w ill aell itself; 20% Protein Egg Mash. Yellow 
Corn only as grain. Growing Mash, Breeders 
Mash, Egg Pellets, Hen Scratch, Steel cut yellow 
corn Chops, and a complete line of sweet Dairy
feeds— none better at any price— ask your neigh-

%
bor who uses it.

W « also have a full line of other feed and grain— 
Wheat. Milo, Oats, Oat Chops. Milo Chops, Milo head 
Chops, ground No. 1 Alfalfa Hay, Alfalfa leaf Meal, 
Bran, Shorts, etc. *

We still invite you to see our new grinder operate—  
the latest thing in grinding and mixing equipment.

Your Complete Feed Business Appreciated.

Simpson’s Mill & Feed Store
Phone 149

beautiful bust o f Burns?” shouted 
the auctioneer. A  lady in the 
crowd informed the auctioneer 
luai ihe bust was Shakespeare. 
“ Well that just goes to show how 
little I know about the Bible,” 
said the' auctioneer.

4 4 4

An old saying: “The success­
ful man is the fellow who has his 
shoes repaired more often than 
the seat of his pants.”

4 4 4

The longest word in the lang­
uage today has gotten to be the 
one you hear over the radio: 
"Now a word from our sponsor!”

♦  ♦
♦  IN DONLEY COUNTY ♦
♦  26 Y n n  Ago ♦
♦ ♦ 
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

Troublesome canyon on the 
Wint Bairfield ranch is fast be­
coming a favorite scenic resort 
for our young folks. Large num­
bers gathere there over Sunday 
and many through the week.

J. W. Owens is looking after 
his ranching interests in the Dal- 
hart country.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Adams visit­
ed friends in Amarillo Tuesday.

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

Mr. and Mrs. G. S. Patterson 
spent the week with their son on 
hi* ranch near Goodnight.

Miss Ruth Stocking left Tues­
day to take a special course in a 
medical school located near New 
York City.

Mrs. B. W. Page, who recently 
came here to reside from Okla­
homa, ft a daughter of the late 
Quanah Parker, chief of the Com- 
anches.

Miss Sybl Smallwood, steno­
grapher in the office of R. H. 
Beville, has gone to Stephenville 
to become stenographer to the 
registrar of John Tarlton college.

Miss Mantie Graves, a travel­
ing saleslady, visited with her 
sister, Mrs. J. T. Patman, the 
first of the week.

Mr. J. F. Cannon’s sister, Mrs. 
Liza Lechner, returned to her 
home at Wheeler Wednesday.

*Joe H. Hurn and James T. 
Bain attended a Knight Tcmpler 
session in Memphis, Monday.

Mrs. E. C. Brittain of Amarillo 
is visiting her daughter, Miss 
Radie Brittain.

Mrs. John T. Sims addressed 
the Amarillo Parent-Teacher As­
sociation Wednesday.
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INSURANCE OF ALL KINDS—

ABSTRACTS OF TITLE

REAL ESTATE NOTARY PUBLIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO,
C. C. POWELL

Phoaa 11 Clarandon

The marriage of Dr. Oscar L. 
Jenkins and Miss Mina Bourland 
occurred <*1 Uie home ot the bnde 
Saturday, October 16, 1920, with 
Rev. C. N. N. Ferguson officiat­
ing.

Mr. and Mrs. T. Jones left Sat­
urday for their annual hunting 
triip to the wilds of western New 
Mexico.

T. N. Clayton, father of S. T. 
Clayton came up from Memphis 
to spend a few days the last of 
the week.

Dr. and Mrs. M. A. Worsham of 
Centerville, Ark. are here this 
week visiting his niece, Mrs. J. T. 
Warren and family.

C. D. Murphy is recuperating 
from a broken collar bone when 
his horse fell on him last week.

T. J. Allen and Miss Ruby 
Busby were quietly married at 
the Dick Allen home here Friday 
evening, Dr. G. S. Slover officiat­
ing.

Rev. Cal C. Wright, pastor of 
the Hedley Methodist church, 
visited friends here Saturday.

♦ H U D G I N S  l
♦  Mrs. S. M. Harp +
♦  4  
4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4

There was a good crowd out 
for Sunday school. Hope all 
come back next Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Delmer Koontz 
and children visited in the Geo. 
Self home Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. John Fowlkes 
and girls visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. O. L. Jacobs Sunday.

Mr. and Mi’s. L. M. Putman and 
family of Goldston, Gerald and 
Dewie Foster and Ray Brogdon 
took Sunday dinner in the Harp

home. Mr. and Mrs. Jack Foster 
and Melvin Fowlkes called in the 
afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. John Perdue took 
dinner with Mr. and Mrs Bill 
Perdue.

Clyde Tims spent Sunday with 
Don Barker,

Miss Velma Tims spent the 
weekend with homefolks.

Those to take Sunday dinner 
in the W. O. Elliott home were 
L. L. Foster, Mr. and Mrs. Pat 
Myers, Duwane Foster, Ben and 
Magdalene Talley, Jerry, Nell 
and Dane Perdue, Dan and Vel­
ma Tims.

Mr. and Mrs. L. C. Tims visited 
awhile Sunday afternoon with 
Mr. and Mrs. D. B. Perdue

Mr. Tom Roy dinner Sun­
day with Mr. and Mrs. D. B. Per­
due.

Miss Hazel Langford of Olton 
is visiting with Mrs. J. C. Perdue 
Jr. and family at this writing.

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Perdue Jr. 
and Linda called in the Harp 
home one day last week.

4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4

♦ G O L D S T O N  *
♦  By Wilma Smith ♦
♦  4 
4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4

Mrs. George McCracken and 
children spent Saturday night 
and Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
R. O. Reynolds.

Mr. and MiA Ed Mooring and 
family of Naylor spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Roy Stewart.

spentMr. and Mrs. Sam Dale 
the weekend in Dallas.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Eichelberger 
visited Mr. and Mrs. H. M. Stew­
art awhile Thursday.

Mrs. H. C. Smith visited Mrs. 
Mattie Hudson awhile Thursday.

Mr. C. Brock and June visited 
in Groom over the weekend.

Juanita Mooring spent Sunday 
with Wilma Smith.

Mr. and Mrs. Eddy Reynolds 
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
R. O. Reynolds.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Roberson 
and family visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Edgar Talley last Monday even­
ing.

Wanda Easter and Duane L it­
tlefield spent Saturday night in 
the H. C. Smith home.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Rey­
nolds visited Delmer Koontz o f 
Hudgins Sunday.

Mrs. H. C. Smith and Wilma 
visited Mrs. Roy Stewart Friday 
night.

Glenda Philley spent Thursday 
night with Dorthy Brock.

Glenda Moore spent last week 
in Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. N. S. Perc'val Jr. 
and Mrs. J. W. Toler and fam ily 
of Amarillo spent the weekend 
with their mother, Mrs. N .S. Per-
cival.

Joe Goldston
OPTOMETRIST
Goldston Bldg. 

Phone 36

STOP and THINK!

BLEACH
Durox— 1 Quart

19c

BEANS
Cut Green. Deer Brand—2 for

PINTO BEANS
Diven, 19 os. Tall Cana—2 for

MUSTARD
Horseradish—Curtis brand ...............................

9c MILK
White Swan—6 Small Cans ...................

35c
PEACHES
Nile yellow cling, sliced— No. 21 2

25c POP-CORN
2 C an s ........................................................

35c
CANADA DRY WATER
Club Soda— 1 Quart .......

23c TUNA SPREAD
Redondo ................................................

29c
ENGLISH PEAS
Temple Sweet ............

12c

COCONUT
FRESH
EACH

30c
Red SPUDS

70 LBS.

33c
CABBAGE

POUND

3 c
CARROTS
. 2 BUNCHES

15c

J V  V  Chocolate Flavor d t f

r  y - M a k  : : r  ,Z 1
W  ■  AUNT LIZZIE

L a u n d ry  ooap - .Z 5
SPECIALS IN  OUR

DRY GOODS DEPARTMENT
New shipment Mill Tex Dresses. . . . . . . $4.95

i Wool BLANKETS. . . . . . . . . . . . . $15.95
All sizes BOYS CAPS 59c up
Mens Over Shoes Boot & Shoe-4 buckle $5.95 
Lee Work Pants and Shirts. . . . . . . . . $2.58 up

FARMERS EXCHANGE
Phone 63-J GROCERY &  M AR K ET  W e Deliver

Quality Meats
Try Our Baby Grain Fed Beef 

It's Different

GLASS CHEESE 19c

KRAFT
DINNER 14c
LONGHORN
CHEESE 59c
BORDENS
GRADED CHEESE .. 9c
BUTTER
1 lb. 95c

l!,(i)llnilll|l llltp ilPIPlIIMIIIlnIWw » -Biiiiia

Dependable Ambulance Service
Our Ambulance service is at your command day 
or night - - - ready to give you the very best ser­
vice possible.

J{lurpfa~£piccr-I$utttin
Funeral Home

24-Hour Ambulance Service Phone 160-A  or B

Gifts”
VISIT OUR

GIFT DEPARTMENT
AND

Take Advantage of 

OUR L A Y  A W A Y  PLAN

Our Stock of Gifts is Most Complete and you 

w ill find a Gift for every occasion.

For Better Toys and Gifts 

----- SHOP N O W !

"YOU ALWAYS SAVE AT THE"

PAINT STORE
i

HUDSON & TAYLO R

Phone 82-M

Jt.
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LAMBERSON—LA  GRONE
Miss Edna Lou Lamberson, 

• daughter of Mr. and Mrs. S. W. 
Lambcrson of Clarendon, became 
the bride of Brack La Grone, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. C. C. La Grone, 
also of Clarendon. The single ring 
ceremony was read at the home 
of the bride’s parents by Rev. 
Hal Upchurch at eight o’clock 
October 12th.

A  fireplace banked with pink 
gladioli and assorted • dahlias 
formed the background for the 
impressive candlelight ceremony.

The bride wore a gray wool 
suit with black and white acces 
sories and a corsage of white 
rosebuds. For something old the 
bride carried a small Bible which 
her great grandfather carried in 
the Civil War.

Mrs. K. R. Rood, twin sister of 
the groom, served as matron of 
honor and Mr. J. T. Lambcrson 
brother of the bride was best 
man.

A reception, which was also at 
the home of the bride’s parents 
followed the ceremony. Pink 
roses and white tapers formed a 
background for the wedding cake 
which centered the bride’s table

Mrs. La Grone is a graduate of 
Clarendon high school where she 
was a member of the Kappa 
Kappa Sorority. Mr. La Grone 
received his education at Gus- 
tine, Texas.

The bride and groom will make 
their home in Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Leek Goldston 
spent the past week in Dallas 
visiting relatives and seeing the 
fair. They went by Big Springs 
where they spent a night with 
their daughter and husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Frey.

PATHFINDER CLUB
The Pathfinder Club met in the 

parlor of the Methodist Church 
Friday, October 11th with the 
following hostesses: Mesdames J. 
H. Howze, C. D. McDowell, W. H 
Patrick, J. R. Porter, Curtis 
Mears, Lee Holland, Oscar Thom­
as, Joe Ritter.

The members and guests were 
greeted at the door by a receiv­
ing line composed of Mrs. Lee 
Holland, Mrs. Joe Ritter, Mr. 
John McCarty, Mrs. John Mc­
Carty, Mrs. Clyde Slavin, Mrs. 
Pat Slavin, Mrs. Ray Palmer and 
Miss Maxine Ellis.

Mr. John McCarty, associate 
editor of the Globe-News, dis­
cussed the Love Life of the 
Ladies at Old Tascosa. The illus­
trations by Mr. Harold Bugbee, 
which were used in Mr. Mc­
Carty’s book, “Maverick Town, 
were exhibited.

During a social hour refresh 
ments were served to members 
and guests.

SENIOR GIRL SCOUTS
The Senior Girl Scouts rr>M 

Monday afternoon at 4 p. m. in 
the Girl Scout room. The meet­
ing was opened by playing a 
game and singing a song. Plans 
were discussed for the Hallowe’­
en party which is to be Oct. 29th 
at the Scout room. It was also de­
cided that this troop would assist 
the P.T.A. at the School Carnival 
Hallowe’en night.

The remainder of the meeting 
the girls worked on belt purses. 
The meeting was closed by the 
group singing “Taps.”

Those present were leaders, 
Mrs. C. B. Morris and Mrs. Bill 
Thornberry Jr., Scouts Shirley 
Brumley, Ira Jean Estlack, Mae 
Morris, Ladell Cox, Arvazine 
Smith, Latricia Andis, Elba Jean 
Ballew, Lois Marie Hommel, Ann 
Thompson. Doris Jean Wallace, 
Ann Robinson.

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

K ILL  KARE KNEEDLE KLUB
Mrs. Eva Draffin entertained 

the Needle Club in her home 
Thursday afternoon. Lovely dah­
lias and roses were used for dec­
orating the guest rooms. The af­
ternoon was spent in talking and 
fancy needle work. At the social 
hour a delicious refreshment 
plate was served to Mesdames 
Ed Speed, Sam Lowe, Gene 
Noland, W. D. Kidd, Major Hud- 
son, R. R. Dawkins, W. B. Sims, 
Misses Ida and Etta Harned and 
hostess, Mrs. Draffin.

.Thursday. October 17. 1946

HONORED WITH 
BIRTHDAY PA $ T Y

Mr. and Mrs. Dwight Blair en­
tertained with a party Monday 
night at their country home hon­
oring Sybil Head on her birth­
day. Dancing and various games 
were enjoyed until a delicious re­
freshment was served to Sybil 
Head and Marvin King, Delene 
Blair and Billy Chilton, Arvazene 
Smith and James Moore and 
Patsy Pittman and R. E. Law­
rence and Mr. and Mrs. Blair.

Mr. and Mrs. McHenry Lane of 
Pampa and Whitcdecr returned 
to their home Tuesday evening 
after a visit with Mrs. Lane’s 
arents, Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Lewis.

2.00 §mr ta r ami a
Limited time only

ROSE  
CREAM  
M ASK

I jM ^

NORWOOD PHARMACY
RELIABLE PRESCRIPTION SERVICE

JUNIOR H. D. CLUB
The Junior H. D. Club met for 

their regular all day meeting at 
the club room Oct. 10th with 13 
members present.

At noon a pot luck luncheon 
was heartily enjoyed by all. A f­
ter a social hour of conversation 
and needle work, the business 
session was held. New officers 
for the new year were voted on 
which resulted in: President, Dol 
lie Wilson, Vice-pres., Ruby 
Blackman; Sec.-Treas., Marguer­
ite Carpenter; Reporter, Nora 
Decker. Two new members were 
voted on. Plans for our annual 
husband party in November were 
discussed.

Those present were Marie Bell, 
Ruby Blackman, Gladys Hom­
mel, Mildred Larimer, Nova 
Mears, Edna Russell, Onq Tatum, 
Mary Wallace, Dollie Wilson, Mo- 
relle Wright, Marguerite Carpen­
ter, Margaret Naylor, Oma Bent­
ley.

The next meeting will be Oct. 
24th w'ith Nova Mears and Emma 
Ayers as hostesses.

1926 BOOK CLUB
Mesdames W. C. Thornberry, 

C. W. Bennett, B. G. Watson, 
N. Cox and Frank White Jr. 

were hostesses to the 1926 Book 
Club members and their guests 
at the club’s annual guest day 
program. The club room was 
beautifully decorated with fall 
flowers arranged by Mrs. Crock­
ett Taylor.

Mrs. Bill Bromley, president, 
introduced the guest reviewer, 
Mrs. McHenry Lane of Pampa. 
Mrs. Lane, a former resident of 
Clarendon and rqomber of the 
club was enthusiastically receiv­
ed by her audience. She very 
cleverly reviewed “Young Un” 
by Harold Best—a story of pio­
neer days in New York.

A fter the review a social hour 
was enjoyed, and the hostesses 
served delicious refreshments to 
about ninety members and 
guests.

HONORED ON BIRTHDAY
Sunday, Oct. 13th, twenty-two 

realtives carried a covered dish 
to the home of G. F. Leathers in 
honor of his birthday anniver­
sary. The families represented 
were: B. J. Leather*, H. K. 
Leathers, Mrs. J. C. Christal, L. 
K. Leathers, D. E. Leathers, Earl 
Aldcrson, L. T. Shelton, W. R. 
Christal, J. R. Leathers.

Call us for
*

Experienced Plumbing Service
AND

Plumbing Supplies
Wo now havo experienced Plumbers working out 
of this Yard that are ready to give you the best in 
plumbing service.

We also have-f' - • -

A COMPLETE STOCK OP 

PLUMBING FIXTURES

Foxworth-Galbraith Lbr. Co.
Phone 21

UNITED COUNCIL OF 
CHURCH WOMEN

The United Council of Church 
Women will meet October 30, at 
the Methodist Church, for a cov­
ered dish luncheon at 1:00. The 
lesson study will be at 2 o’clock.

Donley County Leader. S2 a year.

QUICK RELIEF FROM
Symptoms eff Distress Adplngfrem
STOMACH ULCERS 
Din t o  EXCESS ACID
FreeBeekTeMseV

I  Helper It WHI Cost Yea Netfclas
Orer two million bottle* of tfea WILLARD 
THE ATM ENT hare been eold for relief of
•ymptoms of dtetreee arista* !*--- “ ----- *
and DweSewal Wa n  due to

due to__
Aak for **__________
explain* this treatment

AeM. Sold on 16 day*’ trial*!
"  which folly

Douglas It Goldston Drug Co.

Lelia Lake, Texas 
Leila Lake Drug

1

DR. H. R. BECK
D E N T I S T  

Phone 4«

9 to 12—Office hours—1 to ft 

Goldston Bldg. 

Clarendon. Texas

BIRTHDAY PARTY
Katherine Thompson entertain­

ed with a party at her home 
Tuesday honoring her brother 
Jimmy on his 12th birthday. A f­
ter a few hours of frolic and fun, 
the gifts were opened and admir­
ed. Cake and ice cream were 
served to Albert Louis Johnson, 
Jack and Fred Clifford, Robert 
Olin Bain, Donald Smith, Bud 
Roberson, Earl Morrow and Jim­
my Thompson.

LOCAL CHAPTER TO 
OBSERVE FUTURE HOME 
MAKERS WEEK

Governor Stevenson has pro- 
claimed%the week of October 20th 
to 26th as Future Home Makers 
of Texas week. The Clarendon 
Chapter, will be having special 
meetings and programs that 
week, it was announced by Mrs. 
Glenn Hoggatt, local supervisor.

The club sold Mums last Friday 
for the football game and wish to 
thank everyone who bought 
them. This money will be used

A  Yank in Paris, '46 Version

fiUrcM Administration Photograph

Edmund R. Malo, Lynn, Mass., (right) boards a boat at the Boston 
docks for Paris where he has been enrolled for a 3-year art course 
under the Veterans Administration's educational program. Bidding 
Malo bon voyage is A lan C. Frazer, V A  director of public relations 
for the New England branch area. The veteran is one of the first to 
leave for a foreign school.

for year books and as a starter on 
this years State Camp Fund. 
Watch for the next Mum sale 
which will be for the Memphis 
game November 15th. Let’s all 
wear one to Memphis.

Mr. and Mrs. G. E. Gill of Hico 
have moved to Clarendon. Mrs. 
Gill is the mother of Mrs. Victor 
Smith.

RECEIVES HONOR
J. E. Thompson of the Univer­

sity of Texas has been elected 
president of the Senior law class. 
Jimmy is a son of Mrs. Margaret 
V. Thompson of Clarendon.

Claude Morgan was down Sun­
day from Amarillo visiting his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Jim Mor­
gan.

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 
CHURCH

Rev. Charley B. Robinson, Pastor 
Phone 267-M

A ll members and special 
friends of our church are urged 
to be in their places of worship 
in God’s House every Sunday. 
Likewise we urge each one to 
live the real Christian life every 
day of the week. If you ’ love 
Christ, support His work and do 
your part in His kingdom.

REGULAR SERVICES
9:45 a. m.— Sunday School for 

everyone.
11:00 a. m.— Morning Worship.
6:30 p. m., —  Young Peoples 

League.
7:30 p. m.— Evening Service of 

Praise and Evangelism.
Tune in on the radio at 7:30 

A. M. Sunday and hear the 
Presbyterian half hour of ser­
vices.

This is Church Paper Week. 
Subscribe for your church paper 
and keep up with the great things 
of the church.

The healing of the world’s sick­
ness today can only be done by 
the Gospel of Christ and the 
works of His kingdom. Let all 
Christian people be militant, 
powerful Christians.

ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST.
EPISCOPAL 

The Rev. W. Warrin Fry 
Phone 276 o

18th Sunday A fter Trinity. 
Sunday School, 10 a. m. 
Morning Prayer and Sermon—  

11 a. nj.

Here are food values you can "go buy" because these well-known brands are the first choices for Quality 
and Economy. You know that every package, jar. and can contains the best of everything in good eating— 
flavor - - - goodness - - purity. They're the real "atars" of the food world—and we bring them to you at down 
to earth prices. Yes—you get the best for, less when you buy well-known brands at CLARENON FOOD 
STORE— this town's "buy-word" for bigger and better food values!

S P U D S
No. 1 Whits—Meth Bag

10 LBS.

49c
CIDER

PURE APPLE 

QUART

PUMPKIN
Delmont—No. 2Va Can

FLOUR
Lucky Day—50 lb. Sack

COFFEE
Magnolia—Pound

Y A M S
Maryland Sweats 

POUND

HOMINY
No. 2 ^ C

KRAUT
No. IV t Can

PINTO BEANS
Tall C an .........

PORK A BEANS
Jacksons— No. 2 Can

SARDINES
Tall Can ...

13c
15c
15c

CATSUP
Mario— 14 os. Bottle .

TOMATO JUICE
Dal Havan— No. 2 Can

SOUP POWDER 
Pura—Pound ............

BINDER TWINE

APPLES
Large Roman Beauties

POUND

1 2 ' c
GRAPES

TO KAYS
POUND

20c
23c 
13c 
23c

COTTON SACKS
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CRIB CAPERS AT THE USO

T AKING advantage of USO hos­
pitality at ail early age and 

obviously enjoying it is Robert 
Roger Webber III, being dressed 
in the crib at the USO-Travelers 
Aid Airport Lounge in Burbank, 
California.

Neither the prospect of air 
travel nor the things going on 
behind his back seem to faze the 
young man as bis mother. Hazel

Webber, completes a change, prob­
ably because he's on his way to 
visit his GI dad.

USO-Travelers Aid to service 
men's wives and families are only 
one phase of USO activity, which 
also includes USO-Camp Shows 
for hospitalized OI's and men 
overseas, recreation and a “ home 
away from home” for ’teen-age 
draftees and other members of 
the armed forces through 1947.

Mr. and Mrs. C. M. Johnson 
had her brother and nephew and 
w ife of Bowie as visitors last 
week. They returned home Tues.

The Rev. and Mrs. Fry left 
Wednesday for a Conference of 
the Clergy of The District of 
North Texas. They w ill return on 
Friday.

Mrs. Emily Dilliehay and Mrs. 
Annie Prcyer of Jacksonville, 
Texas, sisters of Henry Williams, 
will arrive in Clarendon Friday 
night for an extended visit with 
Henry Williams and wife.

J. A. Howard visited his w ife 
and daughter at Beaumont the 
weekend

WeiDi
Veteran W iliam E. Carey, 23, 

ex-farm boy and present fresh­
man Aggie student at Texas Tech 
College at Lubbock, is the first 
West Texas veteran to receive his 
specially equipped automobile 
awarded by the government to 
veterans, who have suffered the 
loss of a leg.

He Is the son of Mr. and Mrs. O. 
R. Carey, Rt. 2, Post, Texas.

An Army Infantryman, Carey 
was participating in the Am o 
River campaign in Italy, when, 
on August 18, 1944, he was struck 
by an artillery shell shattering 
his left leg. After 11 months hos­
pitalization, he was discharged 
from the Army in July, 1945.

Carey, a tall, typical West Tex­
an, is quiet and un-assuming. 
" I ’d had my name in the pot for 
a new car for some time, when 
the Veterans administration came 
along and bought it for me; I was 
really happy. Because of all the 
walking to an from classes, I 
might have had to drop out of 
school, but now that I have my 
car I am assured of continuing,” 
he said.

Carey is attending Texas Tech 
under the Veterans administra­
tion vocational rehabilitation 
program for disabled veterans. 
He did not finish high school be­
fore going into military service; 
however, through a series.of tests 
given him by the advisement and 
guidance section of the VA it was 
determined he could do college 
work. He is making an enviable 
record at Texas Tech.

Under Public Law 663, admin­
istered by the Veterans adminis­
tration. World War II veterans 
who are entitled to compensation 
for the loss of, or the loss of the 
use of a leg are entitled to pur­
chase a passenger automobile, 
station wagon, jeep, or tractor not 
to exceed $1500 at government

expense.
Sixty applications have

received in the VA  regional o f­
fice at Lubbock. At the present 
time 39 of the applications have 
been approved, Benjamin O. 
Murph, Adjudication officer said.

The recent veterans adminis­
tration interpretation of Pqblic 
Law 679 which sharply reduend 
subsistence allowances to veter- 
anfe enrolled in farm training has 
been rescinded, V A ’s Dallas 
Branch has been informed by the 
Administration’s Washington O f­
fice.

“Farm trainees can now re­
sume training under the original 
plan and with full subsistence 
payments” , William T. Murphy, 
Director of education in the Dal­
las Branch advised.

“The order is retroactive to 
the date on which the much pro­
tested reduction interpretation 
went into effect. If a veteran has 
had a deduction made from his 
subsistence, VA will repay him. 
This is good news for some 7,500 
veterans in Texas, Louisiana and 
Mississippi. It means they will 
get their full 65 and 90 dollars 
allowances from VA as they did 
iin the past. The order rescinding 
the earlier interpretation has 
been wired to all VA Regional 
offices throughout the three 
states. We are instructing all 
regions to resume operations un­
der the original full payment 
plan.”

According to Eldon F. Fuller, 
Chief, Vocational Rehabilitation 
and Education of the Lubbock 
VA  region office, this new ruling 
will materially effect approxi­
mately 1,000 West Texas veter­
ans enrolled in County Vocation­
al Education Schools.

Mr. and Mrs. Rolle Brumlev 
and daughter Shirley and Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Bennett left Wed­
nesday to visit their sons Carroll 
Brumley and Carl Bennett at the 
Military Academy at Lexington, 
Missouri.

Bill Ray joined a group at 
Amarillo Friday for a hunting 
trip in South Dakota. »

Tom Goodner from Lubbock 
Tech visited his mother, Mrs. 
Goodner the weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. O. W. Latson 
from Amarillo spent the weekend 
with their daughter and family, 
Mr. and Mrs, Bill Bentley. They 
were on their wgy to Childress.

Mrs. Hawell Harding, Mrs. Ray 
Moore, Mr. and Mrs. Loren 
Rhoades of Amarillo and Mr. and 
Mrs. Hubert Rhoades of Ashtola 
visited in the Austin Rhoades 
home over the weekend.

Mr. J. B. Thompson of New’ 
Mexico is visiting his daughters, 
Mrs. E. D. Koen and Mrs. E. L. 
Richarson.

\
THANKS

We wish to thank our many friends and customers for their patronage and 
good will during our operation of the O. 81 S. Grocery.

We wish to state that we have never had the privilege of serving any 
finer people than right here in Clarendon and have certainly en joyed  doing 

business with each of you.
, • f #

We have sold our interests to Mr. Buel Sanford and we w ill appreci­
ate your continued patronage of the firm which w ill be known as the 
Sanford Grocery. We feel sure that he w ill continue to give you the best in 

service and merchandise.

Mrs. Frank Buurland visited 
her daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mn». Bob Dillard at Austin, rela­
tives at Elgin and was joined by 
her husband, Mr. Buurland, at 
Dallas Friday where they visited 
with Dr. and Mrs. Oscar Jenkins, 
returning home Tuesday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Heckle Stark 
have as their house guest, Mi’s. 
John A. Baisch Jr. of Tw in Falls, 
Idaho. Mrs. Baisch is a sister of 
Mrrf. Stark.

Rev. and Mrs. Hal Upchurch 
and son Hal Ray and Mr. and 
Mrs. Geo. Trout left Monday 
morning for a 3 weeks vacation 
trip in Calif., Seattle, Washington 
and other points.

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Drennan of 
Electra visited his daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Estlack Monday and Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. £us Ratcliff from 
Inemado, Texas spent the week­
end visiting his sister, Mrs. Lola 
Barns.

Mr. and Mrs. Fancher Upshaw 
of Amarillo and Mrs. Cook from 
Dallas visited Mi’s. Marguerite 
Goodner Sunday.

Bill Taylor of Pampa visited 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Crock­
ett Taylor Friday night.

Mr and Mrs. G. C. Watson, 
Mrs. Dorothea Mayville and Mrs. 
Lena Antrobus were Amarillo 
visitors Friday.

Mr .and Mrs. L. D. Carlile and 
daughter Leotta of Amarillo vis­
ited Mr. and Mrs. Bud Anderson 
and family Sunday.

Carl Morris from State Univer­
sity at Austin, spent the weekend 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Cap Morris.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank White Sr. 
left Monday for a visit with his 
sister, Mrs. Sam Carroll at San 
Angelo and their son, Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold White at Galveston.

Mr. and Mrs, Arnold Nored and 
son of Abilene visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Victor 
Smith Monday and Tuesday.

Mrs. Bell Smith, mother of 
Victor Smith is visiting relatives 
at Wellington this week.

Progrettin'
Hiram had just walked four 

miles to call on his lady fair.
“Mary,” he began, “you know I 

got a clearin’ over thur and a 
team and wagon, an’ some hawgs, 
an’ some cows an’ I ’low to build 
me a house this fall an’—”

“Mary,” called her mother, “ is 
that young man thar yit?”

“No, maw,” answered Mary, 
“but he’s gettin’ thar.”

TOO LATE TO 
CLASSIFY

FOR SALE —  One red Cow and
calf. See Kennefh Morroy, 
1 block north of roping club 
pens. (35-p)

FOR SALE —  Ventnor Marine 
plywood outboard boats. A lum­
inum Boats, One new Ventnor 
17 Vi foot inboard boat, one 
second hand Ventnor inboard 
boat. New and used Outboard 
Motors. Bert A. Howell, Lake 
McClellan. '  (35-2c>

FOR SALE— Man’s tan overcoat, 
man’s army overcoat, ladies 
new 100% wool red suit, size 
15; new 100% wool agua coat, 
interlined. Call 227. (35-c)

LOST—Tan Billfold containing 
papers belonging to Della 
Waldrop. Finder may leave at 
the Leader office. (35-p)

Donley County Leader. $2 a year

BUY VICTORY BONDS

PAIN  IN  YO U R  BACK
Indicate that your bladder and kid­
neys need attention. The fluids that 
flow through them are irritating. 
CIT-ROS will quickly bring these 
fluids back to normal. Pain ceases 
and gradually the soreness leaves. 
A new remedy for lumbago fs at 
your druggist. $1.00. Get it today at

Douglas & Goldston Drug Co.

Um  this coupon 
♦•» your SPE­
C IA L  Introduc-

Mr. and Mrs. John Morris and 
children of Claude were guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Cap Morris and 
family Sunday.

tory subscription 
—  tiro wooks —  
SO issuos —  only
tU . S. funds)

for YOUR home
How to take  the ruts out of your b reak fast routine . . . 

ways to m oke your k itchen "hom ey" . . . what color to choose 
for your liv ing  room . . . These ore |ust a  few of the in trigu ing 
new ideas furnished d a ily  on the W omon's Page of

THE CH RISTIAN  SCIEN CE MONITOR 
These help fu l ideas are "p lu s va lu e" in th is  d a ily  newspaper for 
the home thot gives you world news interpreted to show its 
im pact on you and your fam ily .

The Christion  Science Publishing Society ,
One, Norwoy Street, Boston 15, M assachusetts

Please enter o speciol introductory subscription to 
The  C h ristian  Science Monitor— 5 weeks 130 issues) for S I
N am e . 
S tree t.
C i t y _
PB-4

.S to te .

V r

0. & S. GROCERY
Mr. and Mrs. M. F. Stone and Mr*. E. W. Outlaw

Meet Our
W M  FOODS

FRUITS VEGETABLES

NOTICE
To My Friends and Former Customers

I HAVE PURCHASED THE .

D. & S. Grocery
And the firm w ill be known in the future aa the

SANFORD GROCERY
I  w ill appreciate the continued patronage of the O. & S. Grocery customers 

and solicit the return of my old friends and customers.

Buel Sanford

- i i s n

QUALITY FOODS
COTTON SACKS — BINDER TW INE COTTON GLOVES —  COTTON DUCK

CLIFFORD & RAY
GROCERIES &  M EA TS

COLD STORAGE LOCKER SERVICE IN CONNECTION
Phone 5 W e Deliver Phone 6

1

!;!!i nil I

ft. : "y

T
O
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F O R  S A L E
FOR SALE— 1 IHC Farmall. with 

Power lift lister, and cultivator. 
Price complete (1,000; also 1 
row binder in good shape, only 
cut 200 acres. Price $150. A. T. 
Posey, Claude, Texas. (33-3q)

M ARTIN  S D. D. T. Livestock 
spray kills and repels flies 
from milking to milking. 

Stocking's Drug Store
Agents

TREAT SEED W HEAT — N e w
Improved Ceresan will kill 
smut blight iin wheat and pre­
vent all seed borne diseases. 
Increase your stand and yield 
in wheat by using this proven 
seed treatment. For sale by 

Stocking's Drug Store

W ATERGLASS sold in bulk at 
Stocking's Drug Store

AM AR ILLO  D A ILY  N E W S  
BARGAIN DAYS! Let us re­
new your subscription for the 
Amarillo Daily News. One 
Year by mail $10.95.

Stocking's Drug Store 
(Amarillo News Agents)

TRUSSES TH AT F IT  — Guaran­
teed truss-fitting at

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE — Good Oil Heater 
and Cream Separator. Call 399 
or see Mrs. Monica Harvey.

(33-4c)

COYOTE BAIT—Dailey’s Super­
ior Wolf Lure. Old Trappers 
favorite. Time tested. Post Paid 
on receipt of $1.00.

Stocking's Drug Store

CHOCOLATE CANDY! — Large 
shipment direct from factory at 

Stocking's Drug Store

HOME COOKED FOODS 
C ITY  CAFE

(32tfc)

WORMS IN LIVE STOCK — 
Globe Phenothiazine is the 
safest and surest remedy for 
removing worms from pigs, 
horses and cattle.

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE —  7 room home in 
southwest part of town. Phone 
325-J. . (27tfo)

TRY OUR SUNDAY DINNERS 
Phone for Reservations. 

C ITY  CAFE
(32tfc)

TONI COLD WAVE SETS— 
Large supply at

Stocking's Drug Store

TRACTOR MAGNETOS
NEW or USED for John Deere, 

Case, Oliver, Allis-Chalmers, 
I-H-C, Moline and others. 

Homer Bones Garage
(7tfc)

MITES 8c BLUE BUGS — Easily 
exterminated * with AVENAR- 
IUS CARBOLINEUM. Guaran­
teed remedy.

Stocking's Drug Store

BULK SULPHUR at
Stocking's Drug Store

WORMS IN  POULTRY — Rid 
your poultry flocks of round 
worms with Dr. Salsbury’s 
Rota-Caps. Buy it at

Stocking's Drug Store

FIRST CLASS 
160 ACRE COTTON FARM 

FOR SALE
DR. W. A. CARROLL 

Claude, Texas

ATTINTION. MOTH IIS ! If looking few 

a barter remedy for Children'* Chet! Colds 
fry Derfeea's Ne-Mo-Ieb, the sew Cole- 
col-camphor treatment. lemembeiv^dovble 
the purchase price refolded If you do nef 
find thU Modern Chest tub more elective 

—35c and 60c of
Douglas & Goldston D rug Co

Here is something new to help 
you solve your gift problems.

"BOOKS OF HAPPINESS"
Theatre Coupon Gift Books 

$1.00 $2.50 $5.00

A gift that will be appreciated 
by all for Birthdays. Christmas 
or Special Occasions.

Now on Sale 
at The Mulkey Theatre

RENEW YOUR SUBSCRIPTION 
to ths Amarillo Daily News 
Now. Bargain Days for a limit 
ed time only. Renew now. 

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE — Used 10 ft. Mc- 
Cormick-Deering broadcast bind 

er. John S. Bugbee. (29tfc)

ELECTRIC HEATING PADS— 
Hospital style. Three fixed 
heats, high, low or medium. 
The very finest in electric 
heating pads just received at 

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE — Remington type­
writer. Good condition. School 
Tax office. (33tfc)

FOR SALE— 8 weaner pigs; also 
regular Fahnall Tractor with 
power lift, new rubber, all late 
type equipment for row crop, 
good condition. John O. Richey, 
Hedley. (35-p)

FIRST A ID  K ITS— Large ship­
ment Johnson Sc Johnsons First 
Aid Kits in Tin. Boy Sc Girl 
Scout sizes. Home and Truvel 
kits. For sale at

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE— Late model Farmall 
12. Complete new rubber, 

new lister bottoms. See N. R. 
Simmons, 3% miles S. Lelia 
Lake. (35-p)

f  OR SALEGuou circulating hest 
er, good condition. Phone 163M 
Mrs. D. F. Wadsworth. (35-p)

FOR SALE or TRADE for small 
Farm—9 room house, city con 
veniences, 9x12 concrete storm 
cellar, small bam and chicken 
house, 1 block of land fenced 
with hog wire. 4 blocks east, 
blocks south of Piggly Wiggly 
carrying $5,000 insurance on 
house. Priced $6,000. J. H 
Adkins, owner. (37-p)

FOR SALE— Hand made crochet 
baby sets. Mrs. J. R. Thomas, 
Phone 392-J. (34-3c)

FOR SALE— 1945 Oliver 60 with 
2-row equipment. Call 277 or 
see Claude Moore. (36-p)

FOR SALE — Four room house 
with bath room. 1 block west 
of Walter Clifford home. To be 
moved. See K. M. Windom.

(35-p)

FOR SALE — Canning Pears 
$1.50 per bushel. R. O. Thomas.

(35-p)

W A N T E D

W ANT TO PASTURE LivesttK-k
by the head. See Mrs. J. M. 
Waddell or R. M. Webb. (35-3c)

DR. J. W. EVANS
D E N T I S T

CLARENDON. TEXAS

HAS RESUMED PRACTICE
Office Hours—1:30 p. m. to 5:00 p. m.

S O U  T H K O A T — T O N S lU IT IS ! For
quick relief from pain and discomfort try 
our A s a tb a s ia -^ o p . If* li a doctor'* pre­
scription that has given relief to thotuand*. 
Guaranteed superlqf or your money back. 
Generou* bottle, with applicator* on, 50c at
Douglas & Goldston D rug Co.

FOR SALE— 18% acre farm, well 
fenced, 6 room house and out­
buildings, % mile northeast of 
Lelia Lake. See R. A. Sisson.

(35-p)

FOR SALE— Thor Washing Ma­
chine in excellent condition. 
Call 242-R or see Clyde Wilson.

(35-2c)

TRY OUR 
ONE DAY

CLEANING SERVICE
We Are Equipped to do it.

SMITH CLEANERS
Phone 189

We Pickup and Deliver

W AN TE D —To do ironing at my 
home. Mrs. Virgil Adams.

(35-p)

F L O O R  BANDING — Quality 
workmanship. Bee John E. Eudy 

at 8hamburger Lumber Co. 
Phone 20. (52tfc)

M IS C E L L A N E O U S
See us for

ELECTRICAL W IRING

W lftlNG  SUPPLIES

Come in and select your RCA. 
Columbia ft Dacca Records.

TYLER ELECTRIC 
Your Wes ting house Dealer

(34-4c)

FARMERS —  If you want more

money ?cr your cotter. see mc- 
before you sell. W ill buy on 
gin sample. Cotton office phone 
83, Hedley. Alabama Hill.

(36-p)

PIANO LESSONS
( Mrs. Page Hannon

5 blocks South of Junior College 
at old Condroq place. Phone 
450-R. (41tfc)

Mrs. Dorothea Mayville who 
has been visiting her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. O. C. Watson has re­
turned to her heme at San An­
tonio.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Billingley of 
Bovina and Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Colliar of Hedley visited Sunday 
in the Fred Combest and Dug 
Scott homes.

NEVER BUY REAL ESTATE 
WITHOUT AN ABSTRACT.

Donley County Ab»tract Company
C. E. KILLOUGH 

Phone 44

DEHORNING CATTLE — Stop 
bleeding with GLOBE A-B-C 
BLOOD - CLOTTING Powder. 
Stops hemorrhage now. 

Stocking's Drug Store

SACCHARIN TABLETS— Three 
bottles limit to customer. 

Stocking's Drug Store

C A T T LE —  Protect your cattle 
from blackleg, Secpticemia and 
other mixed infections with the 
SAFER, SURER and LARGER 
doses of the more potent 
GLOBE BACTERINS Sc VAC­
CINES.

Stocking's Drug Store 
(Agents)

FOR SALE —  Used Typewriter. 
See Wayne McElroy at Cl^fen- 
don Furniture Co. (35-p)

FOR SALE— 3 room house to be 
moved. See J. F. Cook, Claren­
don, Texas. (35-p)

ftn elecftio e e l, so  watt ?
All right, then, he r-eel-y isn’t an eel at all, if you want 
to be technical. His name’s Electrophorus (Gymnotus) 
Electricus— Jim for short. He’s a South American 
cousin of the carp and catfish.
Maybe Jim does pack a wallop of 600 volts when he’s hungry 
or annoyed (and he has a shocking temper)— BUT__

Cor he wash 3 tubs of clothes?

Or toll the correct time
for 4 days?

FOR SALE — Waldron (estate) 
farm, 315 acres, 6 room house, 
6 miles northeast of Lelia 
Lake. Can’t be beat for sure 
high production; worth the 
money. See or write J. F. 
Waldron at farm, Naylor Rt., 
Clarendon, Texas. (34-p)

FOR SALE— 1 International No. 
61 Combine; one 1945 Model M
Case Combine; one 8x16 M&M 
Drill; one 1928 Chevrolet Motor 
with four speed transmission. 
B. M. Britten, Groom, Texas.

(37-p)

FOR SALE— 1 row John Deere 
Binder; 10 ft. IHC Broadcast 
power Binder; Seed Barley. 
Castleberry Bros. (35-p)

DEALERSHIP open for Fuller 
Brushes in Donley Sc Hall 
Counties. Can average $50 to 
$75 per week. For full details 
write P. O. Box 1491, Amarillo, 
Texas. (36-p)

NURSE LOSES FAT 
SAFELY AYDS WAY
(ifilhM M rM illbvfcnfdM

Eat attrehea, potato**, Entry, 
. A Y D SV lu m b  

Plan la safe, 
) extra**. No 

laxative*.
K cut down.'

r ' ■
dmg*.

iy  Reducing I  
ble. easier. No 
a. No laxatives

Nur** w*a o a * o f a o r « t k u  
IS# paraona toaini 14 to  I t  lb>. iran|« la * few wnto
’■“ w a i t S

Delicious AYDS before each meal dulls the ap 
petite. Yet; 
nutrients, '
Candy way to l< 
ef Ayda. *2.25.

box if you don’t get results. Pbone
NORWOOD PH AR M AC Y 

Phone 1

£

Or light a hundred-watt bulb 

for 3 hours—
for a penny?

m
You bet he can’t. He’s not usefully eel-ectrified. Frankl 

you’d better flip a switch if you want convenient, dependab 
electricity— all you need— at low cost.

And speaking o f low cost— did you know that the average 
family is getting twice as much electricity for its money as it 
did 15 years ago? That’s no accident— like Jim and his tempera­
mental voltage. Folks in this company have done a good job 
under sound business management. That’s why your electric 
service is lower in cost— and higher in efficiency— than ever 
before.

WfestTexas UtilitiesCompany

1. Hold Your U. S. War Bonds
Don’t let anyone talk you into cashing them. Be 
wary of “get-rich-quick” schemes. Extravagant 
promises are a poor substitute for the safety and 
guaranteed return of your War Bonds.

2.. Buy U. S. Savings Bonds
They are identical with Series “E” War Bonds and
both are the world’s best investments---- backed
by the full resources of the United States Govern­
ment - - - returning $4 at maturity for every $3 you 
invest.

HELP FIGHT INFLATION BY BUYING U. S. 

SAYINGS BONDS— BY DOING SO YOU ARE 
ALSO HELPING YOURSELF.

B

Soa us about buying or sailing any kind 

of U. S. Government Bonds.

First National Bank
CLARENDON. TEXAS

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

In Stock
B  HOME RADIOS - Electric & Battery

•  CAR RADIOS

B  RADIO-PHONO Combination

•  ..RADIO BATTERIES

•  CAR ANTENNAS

•  TUBES and PARTS

e

Complete Service on all Makee 
Home and Car Radios

ALL SERVICE A PARTS GUARANTEED 90 DAYS

.F O R  F R E E  P IC K -U P  & D E L IV E R Y  

S E R V IC E  P H O N E  119

YOUR MOTOROLA DEALER
0

CLACK RADIO SERVICE
CLARENDON

POSSUM FLATS . . .  " h e a v e n  o n  ea r t h ' • y Gr a h a m  hunter
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Tie a string around
your finger!
DON'T FORGET —It's tints to change your oil. 

REMEMBER — Change to Phllllpa 66 Motor Oil.

Get out that old, beat-up 

summer oil!

Put in that fresh winter-grade 

lubricant! And

make it Phillips 66 Motor Oil! 

You couldn't give your car 

a better break!

Get set for Winter-  with Phi//ips66f
LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM 

GAS ORDINANCE
An Ordinance regulating the use, 
handling, transportation and stor­
age of any form of manufactured 
or Liquefied petroleum gases; 
fixing inspection fees; and pro­
viding a penalty for violations 

BE IT  ORDAINED BY THE 
C ITY  COMMISSION OF THE 
C ITY  OF CLARENDON, TEX­
AS:

Section 1. That all persons, 
firms, or corporations who may, 
from and after the effective date 
of this ordinance, install or equip 
any residence, business house or 
apartment house, or any dther 
building located and situated 
within the corporate limits of the 
City of Clarendon with any in­
stallation or equipment designed 
to use as a fuel any form of man­

ufactured or liquefied petroleum 
gases, shall use in any such in­
stallation, whether for domestic 
or industrial use, only a standard 
grade of pipe or piping, and all 
npnliances used in connection 
with' any such installation shall 
be a standard grade and type of 
equipment. Any system. which 
uses any form of manufactured 
or liquefied petroleum gases must 
bear the label of approval or list­
ing of the Underwriter’s Labora­
tories. The storage of any lique­
fied petroleum gases in any in­
dividual customer size of con­
tainer, either above ground * or 
underground, is prohibited inside 
of or underneath any building in 
the corporate limits; and no 
equipment using liquefied petrol­
eum gases shall be permitted 
within the fire limits; and no 
equipment used for the purpose

X i fO l t M I M I l l

Rom where I sit .../y Joe Marsh,

Want a Vacation 
from Marriage?

Alvin Blake went south on hia va­
cation, for some fishing, and left his 
Missus to enjoy a vacation from the 
corncob pipe, clothes in a heap, and 
solos on the harmonica.

First few days, Martha enjoyed 
it—house neat and quiet, top back 
on the toothpaste, no morning mess 
from Alvin’s midnight snacks (A l’s 
partial to a bit of cheese and beer 
at bedtime).

Come the end of the week, she 
began to fidget; couldn’t even read 
the Clarion, it looked so unmussed; 
didn’t have any appetite with no­

body to cook for. She was about to 
wire Al, when he barges home a 
neek ahead of time, and she almost 
cries for gratitude. (MFelt the same 
way myself,” says AL)

From where I sit, those differ­
ences o f habit and opinion — 
whether they have to do with corn­
cob pipes, a glass of beer, or play­
ing the harmonica, seem mighty 
trivial when you’re separated. And 
they are, too!

•

of storing wholesale quantities of 
such gases shall be permitted 
within Jhe corporate limits of the 
city.

Section 2. The term “Standard 
Grade” as used herein shall 
mean that grade of article which 
is accepted by dealers in such 
equipment and recognized as 
complying with all fire law regu­
lations.

Section 3. Any such equipment 
as provided for shall be installed, 
or repaired, in a workmanlike 
manner which shall comply with 
all laws and the regulations of 
the City, the regulations of the 
National Board of Fire Under­
writers and the regulations re­
commended by the National Fire 
Protection Association.

Section 4. When any such 
equipment is installed as herein 
provided, same shall not be plac­
ed  in operation or used unless 
and until said installation has 
been approved, as complying 
with this ordinance, by the City 
Inspector.

Section 5. Any person, firm or 
corporation installing any such 
equipment as herein provided 
shall secure the approval of same 
as complying with the require­
ments of this ordinance by the 
City Inspector, as herein provid­
ed for, and shall, upon request­
ing such inspection for approval,

Copyright, 1946, United States Brewers Foundation

Dr. Keith S. Lowell
GENERAL PRACTICE 
. AND SURGERY

Offices in Goldston Bldg. 

Offica Phona 126 

Rosidanca Phona 174

Statement ôf Condition of

THE FARM ERS STATE  B A N K
of Clarendon, Texas, at the Close of Business Sept 30. 1946

pay an inspection fee of $1.00 for 
each piece of equipment, to cover 
cost of inspection.

Section 6. A ll tank trucks and 
tank trailers used for the trans­
portation of liquefied petroleum 
gases within the City shall be so 
constructed and operated as to 
comply with the regulations for 
the design, construction and op­
eration of automobile tank trucks 
and tank trailers for the trans­
portation of liquefied petroleum 
gases as approved by the Nation­
al Board of Fire Underwriters 
and the National Fire Protection 
Association. Any person, firm, or 
corporation who shall operate or 
cause to be operated any tank 
truck or tank trailer used for the 
purpose of transporting liquefied 
petroleum gaas within the cor­
porate limits of the City shall 
keep any such equipment in good 
condition at all times, and upon 
the development of any defect 
that would create a hazard to 

, persons or property, said tank 
truck or tank trailer shall be re­
moved from the streets of the 
City until such defects have been 
repaired, or faulty equipment re­
placed; and any such tank trucks 
and tank trailers shall be subject 
to inspection by the proper au­
thorities at any time. No tank 
truck or tank trailer shall be 
parked, stored or operated upon 
any street within the fire limits; 
nor shall they be stored or re­
paired inside or outside of any- 
building within the fire limits as 
defined by ordinance.

Section 7. A ll liquefied petrol­
eum gas sold within the City 
shall be treated with a malodor­
ant in such quantities as required

by State Law to create an odor 
easily detected in case of leaks 
in piping or equipment.

Section 8. Any person, firm or 
corporation violating any provis­
ions of this ordinance shall be 
deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, 
and upon conviction for violation 
thereof, shall be fined in any sum 
not to exceed One Hundred Dol­
lars ($100.00); and each day of 
use or operation of any such 
equipment shall constitute a sep­
arate offense.

Section 9. In the event any sec­
tion or part of section or provis­
ion of this ordinance shall be 
held invalid, such invalidity shall 
not affect the valid portions here­
of, which shall be enforceable 
regardless of such holding.

Section 10. The fact that there 
does not now exist any rule or 
ordinance regulating and con­
trolling the installation or use of 
manufactured or liquefied pe­
troleum gases within the corpor­
ate limits of the City of Claren­
don, which said gases are highly 
volatile and inflammable and if 
not properly controlled and regu­
lated constitute a dangerous and 
hazardous condition affecting life 
and property, creates an emer­
gency and imperative necessity 
for the immediate preservation 
of the public welfare and safety, 
which necessitates the suspension 
of the rule requiring ordinances 
to be read on three separate days 
before the final passage thereof, 
and that no ordinance shall be­
come effective before the expir­
ation of ten days from the time 
of its final passage; wherefore 
such rules are hereby suspended 
and this ordinance shall be effec­
tive from and after its final pas­
sage, and it is so ordained.

Passed and approved this the 
8th day of July A. D. 1946.

APPROVED:
C. B. Morris, Mayor

ATTEST:
Mae Shaver, City Secretary

(35-c)

♦ LE LIA  LAK E  ♦
♦ ♦
♦  Mrs. H. R. King ♦
♦  ♦  
4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4

Mrs. Evelyn Murphy and son 
Gu£ left Tuesday for Memphis, 
Tenn.

Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Wood and 
granddaughter Doris were Ama­
rillo visitors Tuesday.

Mrs. Price and Mrs. Power of 
Estelline visited here Thursday.

Rev. Cooksey and family are 
moving this week to Vega and 
will be pastor of Vega Baptist 
church.

Mrs. Ed Morton and Doris are 
spending the fore part of this 
week with relatives in Amarillo. 

Ted Tomlinson spent the past

week here with relatives. He re­
cently arrived home a t‘ Lubbock 
from Japan and has an honorable 
discharge from the army.

Mr. and Mrs. V. P. Darnell 
were Amarillo visitors Thursday.

Mrs. Pauline Roberts of Ama­
rillo came Saturday for a few 
days visit with relatives and 
friends.

Mr. and Mrs. Wilson Barton 
and Charles Scaff of Matador 
spent Sunday here with relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Adell Williams of 
Borger spent the weekend here 
with friends.

Mrs. E. R. Myers visited with 
friends in Amarillo and Borger 
this week.

Miss Edna Wood of the Dumas 
faculty spent the weekend with
homefolks.

Mr. and Mrs. T. W. Armstrong 
of Okla. City spent the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Basil L. Hurst, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Albert S. 
Brown.

Mrs. E. R. Mayville of San 
Antonio has been visiting for 
several days in the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mi's. O. C. Wat­
son.

CARE FOR YOUR 
F L O C K

H ave you w orm ed your flock yet? Com e in and 

let us show  you how  - - • the Purina w ay.

See us for a ll your sanitation needs.

Dependable
FEEDS

W e carry a com plete line of

PURINA & MERRIT FEEDS
• the feeds you can depend upon.

W E  B U Y  A N Y  A N D  A L L  K iN D S  O F G R A IN . 

See us before  you sell as w e  pay 

h ighest possible M arket Prices.

CLARENDON GRAIN CO.
JUD E C L A U N C H . M gr.

wtesuenal

BUSINESS MAN

Dr. J. Gordon Stewart
PHYSICIAN 6 SURGEON

Office in Latson Bldg. 

Ground Floor 

Office Phone 139 

Residence Phone 253

ASSETS .

Loans & Discounts .........................  $477,439.61

Overdrafts ................................... ; . .  1,069.25

LIAB ILIT IES

Banking House, Furniture & Fixtures 8,027.00 Capital Stock . . . v ................... .^...$ 50,000.00

Other Real E s ta te ............................ LOO

Stock in Federal Reserve Bank ----  1,800.00

School Warrants .............................. 5,235.26 Other Liabilities

Surplus & Profits ............................  26,310.97

51.80

Other Resources .............................. 850.00

U. S. Gov’t Securities $407,473.00 

Cash & Due
From Banks .’.......  574,247.35 981,720.35

DEPOSITS ...................................... 1,399,779.70

Total ................11,476.142.47 Total .91,474,142^7

OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS

J. W. Morrison, Chm. of the Board 
J. D. Swift, President Van Kennedy, Cashier

J. H. Hum, Vice-Pres. G. F. Leathers

Mombor of Fodoral Rasorvo System 
Momhor Fodoral Deposit Insurance Corporation

O  U  A W A R t  ?

W I0 T* AFRICAN PI6 HM 
ELEPHANTS ARE ON A N *E R *at 
AROUND FOUR FEET HUSH • 

THINE UTTLL FELLOW* ARC VtUV
plaVful and  hank an affection- 

•  a t e  oiapoemoN.

There’s nothing average about 
the CLARENDON RADIO SER­
VICE. This Is the place where 
you’ll find the best radios and 
radio repairs for less. Come to 
or call us anytime - - - we’ll be 
pleased to be of service to you.

C (a  'lo n d cn H a d irS ltu m
K UP f.. DELIVERY

kr.DYU K / [j v I '/'lUi'T I J PA Li -i.

W. M. PATMAN

Your Southwestern L ifeU n d er­

writer is a professional ousiness 

man, engaged  in one o f  the 

Nation’s leading professions. H e 

equips himself through continu­

ous study and training to give 

you the highest possible degree 

o f l i fe  insurance counsel and 

service. H e is adept through ex­

perience at applying sound principles o f life  insurance to the solution o f 

personal and business problems. H is profession requires that he keep 

abreast o f the constantly changing economic picture.

\

His Rate Book contains the facts on how and what to save to provide 

protection for your family . . .  mortgage cancellation . . .  or business 

insurance. H e  has the means to assure your children a college education, 

or to start a business o f their own. He can show you the easiest, least 

expensive way to provide a retirement income for old age. H e is ready 

to counsel with you at any time, without obgligation. Ask him today 

for a plan for you to consider* •

S o u  t
C. t . O ’ PONNI U .  M  E $ IP i  NT

rn Life
HOME OFFICE JL JPfiU'AS
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’Rockets Defeat 
Bronchos 27-0

The largest crowd to see a 
football game in Clarendon in 
recent years was on hand last 
Friday night to witness the defeat

P A S T I M E  
T H E A T R E

yf V* . fci-

LAST TIMES 

TH URSD AY

“Black Angel”
Saturday Only

-if.O bfc^Cv 
ROD CAMERON

'■ —in—
► £V bb ’

“ Code of The 
^Lawless”

Plus
.'HOP H A RR IG A N "

Saturday Prevue 
11:30.

&  Sunday Matinee
JACK CARSON

“ Two Guys from 
Milwaukee99

Wed. & Thurs.
MADELINE CARROLL 

—in—

U \ 7* • • 99Virginia

of the Bronchos by the Welling­
ton Skyrockets 27-0. The game 
was not a run-away as the score 
indicates as the Rockets were 
able to take advantage of several 
breaks that placed them in scor­
ing position and they had the 
power and experience to drive 
over for the tallies.

I. D. Russell was the main 
spark of the Rocket team, taking 
the ball over for three of the 
counters in each of the first three 
periods and Copeland caught a 
pass and went over for the other 
score in the fourth period. The 
Rockets blocked1 two Clarendon 
punts which put them in scoring 
position both times and had it 
not been for the blocks, the 
Broncs might have held them 
down to a much 'lower score. 
Another of their counters was 
brought about when Russell in­
tercepted a Bronc pass and ran 
untouched for 55 yards and the 
counter.

The Broncs were just outclass­
ed by the visitors as a majority 
of their players were big and had 
from two to five years exper­
ience. Our boys did a mighty fine 
job of holding the score down as 
low as they did. It looked as 
though the Broncs were lagging 
on their blocking and holding the 
line, but the experience of the 
Rockets could have caused that 
difference very easily.

The Bronc back field had very 
little opportunity to really get 
started as the strong Rocket line 
was in on them before they could 
hardly make their turn through 
the line. Little Chilton made 
some nice gains and Hcrp did 
some fine line plunging that 
picked up a goodly part of the 
Bronc yardage. Whitscll was iri 
there us usual, getting more than 
his share of thfe tackles.

The Broncs put up a good scrap 
all through the game but were 
playing a team that had them 
outclassed before the game ever 
started. Maybe next year, they 
will have to let some of those 
boys graduate and then we can 
meet them on a more even 
ground.

The two Lubbock boys Vincent 
and J. B. Thompson, shown in the 
picture on the front page of the 
Leader last week are nephews <?f 
Mrs. E. D. Xoen of this city.

William Crowe, Jr .

Dr. William Crowe, Jr., pastor 
of the First Presbyterian Church 
of Wilmington, N. C. will be t'ie 
speaer on the Presbyterian hour 
next Sunday morning, October 
20, at 7:30 A. M., over an inde­
pendent network of south-eastern 
radio stations.

Born in Frankfort, Kentucky, 
Dr. Crowe attended Southwest­
ern Presbyterian University, 
where he graduated in 1921. He 
took his theological training at 
Xenia Theological Semiq^ry and 
at Union Seminary in Richmond 
His first pastorate was in Lemar 
Missouri, and from there he went 
to the Presbyterian ehui^ph of 
Tuscumbia, Alabama In 1 J926. 
Later he served churchy in Tall­
adega, Alabama, and Blueficld, 
West Virginia. In 1942 he was 
called to his present pastorate in 
Wilmington.

Dr. Crowe has contributed to 
the “Christian Century Pulpit,” 
the “Union Seminary Review,” 
the “Presbyterian Outlook” , and 
many other religious magazines 
and periodicals.

The subject of Dr. Crowe’s ad­
dress next Sunday will be “Talk­
ing Back to Life.”

This radio broadcast can be 
heard in Clarendon over radio 
station KGNC, Amarillo.

Miss Annie Hinkle from Dumas 
spent the weekend with home- 
folks.

Mrs. Glenn Hoggatt attended 
the Plain Homemaking Teachers 
conference at Canyon Saturday.

Wtore i*the Store*
ph*

\ \

LETTUCE 4 A
Large Heads |/,C

LEMONS i Q „
1 Pound 10  C

ONIONS A
Yellow—1 pound v C

CARROTS 1 C r
2 Bunches I v C

CABBAGE A 
Firm Green Heads—Pound *|C

SPUDS O A r
Learge Rad—10 lbs.........................V V v

LIGHT BULBS —  ~  .12
15 to 60 watt

APRICOT NECTAR A t
46 am. . ^ ...........................

ORANGE JUICE E f t

JU'C*O f i rLone Star—No. 2Vi Can JsUC
GRAPEFRUIT JUICE M  A f t
46 oz.—3 for $ I . U V

DRIED PEACHES A A  
1 Pound ....................................  L v C

PEACHES A A  
. W. S. Heavy syrup—No. 2Vi Can___V fc C

f i l f f p p  J .  ^V U l I v V  AD M IRATIO N # * 1 % /

APPLES «
Delicious—Pound .. I w V

BAKING POWDER 4  A
Clabber Girl—25c sise I v C

j !  V  I
s o a p ; V a a
Sweetheart—3 for ........... ..............4 V C

FLY SPRAY A C
Flit. 5% DDT—Quart "K JC

»
7  /  M  ...........

PINTOS A A
Naw crop—2 lbs. ...............  4 v C

•

MATCHES
Pla-Safe—Carton *............ L L C

F L O U R  $1.75
CUMMK v «  . 
1 Quart ...... . IO C

BINDER TWINE M  4 E  
Bale . . . . . .  $6.50 . . Ball ..... $  |« 1 3

MftlxMs M  4 C
Pura Gold f l s & i l

SHAMPOO E A
Modart ...............................................U 9 C

A P P L E S
DELICIOUS

POUND

12c

Cloth Sack—25 lbs. ............ . $1.85

25 lb. Sack
YUKO N 'S  BEST FLOUR
- ; . - $1.60 50 lbs. . . . . .  \ . . . . .  $3.15

S P U D S
10 LB. SACK

29c

Yukon's Best Lay Mash----
100 lbs. t

-It w ill really get your hens on the right track.

MOTHER’S OATS—Large box . . . . . .
\ %

. .  35c
TOMATOES
No. 2 Can 15c PICKLES

Sour—Quart Jar 25c
SARDINES
Flat Cans—Each
,

9c BAKING POWDER
Clabber Girl—25 ox. Can

/ 18c
WIENERS WfTH BEANS
Jar—Only .......................... 23c, LAUNDRY SOAP 

Bar 10c

* 9

PLENTY OP COTTON SACKS CAKE FLOUR

PINTO BEANS-2 lbs. . . . . . . . . . . . . .  M e
Whole Grain CORN—12 oz. Can 
HAMBURGER MEAT-1 Pound

• • • • • • • • • •

• • • • • • • •

RIB STEW—1 Pound. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 21c
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Jimmy Moore, lftth Co ogres - 
sioasl District ('emnunder of 
American LtfiM  meets Dea C. 
BorC FleM Director «f the sKe 
sale at Paatex for the prcvuc. 
Other shots show Moore maklnc 
the aeeessarr steps all G l’s 
mast take te complete pur­
chase. The AmarHle sole is the 
first et Me kind la Texas. G l’s 
here first chance at parehase of 
rare stocks for commercial bnsi-
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PANTEX
ORDNANCE DEPOT

AmarMo, Texas

OPEN TO CERTIFIED VETERANS OF WORLD WAR 11
OCT. 28-NOV. 1, 1946

RFC Buying fo r  Small Business - - - - - -  Nov. 4 Non-Profit Institutions and Instrumentalities - Nov. 6
State and Local Governments - - - - - -  Nov. 5 Trade (Non-Priority Buyers) - - - - - -  Nov. 7, 8

SALE HOURS 9:00 A.M. TO 3:00 P.M. DAILY EXCEPT SATURDAYS, SUMOAYS ANO HOLIDAYS

L I S T  O F  I T E M S
CLOTHING

Atworied Nixes
442 Coveralls, S os. white duck,

ladies’
2942 Coveralls, C as. white duck,

ladies'
3*43 Coveralls, Herringbone twill,

men’s
561 Sweat shirts, color pearl, largs 

siae
2036 Sweat shirts, white 
256 Underwear, men’s, winter 

3155 Underwear, HYI), Munsingwear 
2936 Underwear, Bv'D, Munsingwear 
1280 Underwear, long 
1716 Underwear, men’s, long

78 dox. Socks, sweat, men’s, heavy 
cotton, white

410 Shirts, guard, blue, 100% wool 
gabardine

10 Shirts, guard, blue, 100% wool 
gabardine

118 Shirts, fireman, gray, 100% wool 
gabardine

T5 Raincoats, men’s, eordnroy oak
lar, oil skin

40 Hats, rain, oilcloth, chin strap 
H Hats, fireman, plastic 

6i Pants, cooks, white cotton dack 
02 Pants, cooks, black and white 

check, cotton 
17 Pants, cooks
74 Pants, guard, blue, 100% wool 

gabardine, black stripe with

Iellow trim
’ants, fireman, gray, 100% wool

Jgabardine, black stripe 
'ants, guard, blue, 100% wool 

gabardine, black stripe, yellow 
trim

4 Pants, bunker, heavv black durk, 
detachable rubber inside 

660 Caps, guard, wool gabardine.
oilcloth bill, blue

S8 Caps, guard, wool garbardiwo. 
oilcloth bill, blue

444 Caps, fireman, 100% wool gab 
ardine, gray, oilcloth bill 

10 Caps, fireman, 100% wool gab­
ardine, gray, oilcloth bill 

26 Caps, fur lined, leather cover 
84 Caps, rooka. white, vented top, 

“ I'antex Cafeteria” 
f  Caps, ladies’, cotton, tan with 

brown bill, tie string 
69 Overcoat, guard, 100% wool 

worsted, % satin lining, blue 
M, Coats, CCC, Mackinaws, green, 

wool
64 Coat, bunker, outside water-

Itroof, removable waterproof 
ining, tan duck

32 Coats, bunker, outside water-

riroof, removable waterproof 
ining, heavy black duck 

38 Frock Coats, foreman, c ittm 
herringbone twill, white 

137 Frock Coats, ladies, cotton gab­
ardine, white

184 Jackets, guard, 100% wool gab* 
ardine, blue

44 Jackets, fireman, 160% gabar­
dine. gray

4 Slacks, ladies, brown, cotton 
19 Slacks, ladies, blue, cotton 
67 Uniforms, waitress, light tan, 

cotton
21 Mlouse, ladies, for slack suits, 

blue
96 Aprons, bib. 23” long, head and 

waist straps, light brown

NEW FOOTWEAR
356 prs. Shoes, men’s, leather, low, 

safety toe, sises 7 to 12 
456 prs. Shoes, men’s, leather, high, 

safety toes. Mien 7 to 12 
183 prs. Shoes, men’s, work, all rob­

ber, steel toe, 6 prs. size 6; 
13 prs. size 7; 56 prs. size 8; 
38 prs. size 9; 28 prs. size 
10; 39 prs. size 11; 3 prs. 
size 12

44 prs. Shoes, men’s, all rubber, 
work, safety toe, sizes 6 to 
12

841 prs. Shoes, women’s, leather, 
work, low, safety toe, sizes 
5 to 10

282 prs. Shoes, women's, work, safe­
ty steel toe, 6 prs. size 5; 3 
prs. size 5%; 15 prs. size 6; 
46 prs. size 6% ; 54 prs. size 

. 7; 57 >rs. size 7 %; 59 prs. 
size 8; 10 prs. size 8 %; 17 
prs. size 9; 15 prs. size 10

17 prs. Shoes, women's, work, all
leather, safety toe oxford. 6 
prs. size 5; 4 prs. size 5%; 
7 prs. size 7

72 prs. Overshoes, men's, rubber 
with cloth top. sizes 7 to 13

18 prs. Overshoes, men's, slip on. all
rubber, sizes 7 to 12

3 prs. Overshoes, arctics, men’s, 
rubber, and doth top, sizes 
7 to IS

22 prs. Overshoes, women’s, 12”, all 
rubber and cloth top, sise 
small, medium, and large

36 prs. Hoots, men's knee, all rub­
ber, sixes 7 to 12

GENERAL HARDWARE
1,666 PALLETS, warehouse truck, 

size 36” x60” , made of 1* oak 
floor nailed to 2"x3" oak run­
ners mounted on 4 steel legs. 
Used.

36 TRUCK LIFT. Yale hyd., hand 
operated. All steel construc­
tion. Overall dimension: 73” x 
2C »9", fibre pressed non-con- 
duetive tires.

1T8 TRUCK LIFT. Mfg. Barrett 
Cravens Co., Chicago, III. Steel 
construction. 70” overall length. 
Height 11” . hand operated. Bed 
sise 6Q”x27” .

46 TRUCK LIFT, Mfg. Yale and 
Towne, Model BW960, cap. 2500 
lbs^ hydraulic, fibre pressed 
tires, overall dimensions 71” x 
26” z 8 r a i s e s  to 11’. Has 
coupling front and rear.

•  TRUCK LIFT, hand hyd.. Mfg. 
Yale and Towne. Cap. 4,660 
lbs.. Model Y4RR935-1642, fork 
type, I kydranlic lift forks 9”x 
42"*3” , wheels static conduc­
tive.

16fi TRUCK LIFT. hyd.. Mfx. Bar­
rett A  Craven* Co. Overall 
60” x27"x0” . Raisei to approx. 
11’ high.

166 WHEELS, 7”  x 2”  x %”  bore. 
Formien composition roller 
bearing, hub net in I% "x2% * 
steel bashing, serk fittings, ma­
chined trend. Mfg. Formien

13 WHEELS, truck, whse., 6” x2” x 
2%” bore, solid rubber, w/steel 
» lr * » «  bearing molded in, bear­
ing width 2%*. Berk fitting.

23 WHEELS, truck, whse.. 9"x4”x 
1%” bore, fibre tread, 7”  cast 
steel hnb, serk fitting.

J1< WHEELS, truck, whse.. 6”  x 
2,/j "x l 7/»” bore, no center bush­
ing, serk fitting, made of high­
ly compressed fibre or Textalite.

563 WHEELS, H.D. Track, wh*r„ 
9” x2” xl %”  Imre, fibre trend, 
7”  steel core, serk fitting.

416 WHEELS, track, whse., 6” x8” x

1%” bore, fibre trend, stool
core, zerk fitting.

172 CASTERS, medium heavy duty 
industrial swivel type. 8"x2%” 
steel spoke wheel. Roller bear­
ing bsse 9%” x6". Height 10%”. 

172 CASTERS, medium heavy duty 
industrial stationary type. 8"x 
2'/«” steel spoke wheel. Roller 
bearing base 8%”x6”. Height 
10

66 prs. HINGES, tee, extra heavy 
5” , #908. Parked ia original 
cartons.

BINDING MATERIALS
40.700 lbs. JUTE ROPE, No. 1, sise 

•A” , Ludlow Mfg. A Sales Co. New, 
shelf worn.

65 rolls CKL O-GLASS. size 36” x 
100’, in original cartons. DuPont 
product, made of %’o. 32 galv. wire, 
14 mesh, embedded in a substance 
resembling lacquer. New.

150 bales TW NE, rotton. wrapping, 
soft laid 14 thread. 2'/* lb. cose*.

350 rqlls TAPE, cloth, rubber lines* 
% to 1%” wide.

123 rolls FASTENERS, corrugated, 
%”  saw tooth strip, wound left. In 
7 lb. rolls. New, shelf worn.

5 rolls FASTENERS, corrugated, 
saw edge, %” strip in 12 lb. rolls, 
wound right, ased for fastening 
wood joints, new.

7 kegs FASTENERS, corrugated, 
saw edge divergent pattern, sise 
%x5” . used for fastening wood 
joints, in 100 lb. kegs.

14 kegs FASTENERS, corrugated, 
saw edge, divergent pattern, sise 
^"xS*. used for fastening wood 
joints, in 100 lb. kegs.

CONTAINERS
GARBAGE CANS, w/lids. appro*. 

26 gal. rap., galv.. used.
26 WASTE CANS, white enamel, 

w/foot control lid. 11” din. IS” 
deep. W/galv. container w j 
handle. Container 16%” dia. by 
16” deep. New.

1,138 FIBRE CARTONS, band car­
rying type, made of gray A ” 
fibre board, 1" wooden bottom, 
outside dimensions with Hd 
15%” long, 13%” wide. 16%” 
high. Round corners, 2 leather 
handles on each end. New.

173 dot. FRUIT JARS, Kerr, % gnL, 
w/lids.

USED HAND TOOLS
Shovels, hoes, picks, rakes, spades, 

scythes, railroad car movers, spike 
puller, tamping bar, pneumatic 
tampers, hammers, bits, sledge 
hammers, vises, jacks, wrenches, 
small shop hammers, small buffer 
wheels, small screw drivers, star 
drills, cable clips, carpenter levels, 
hand operated bolt threading ma­
chines, stock and dies.

INDUSTRIAL 
RUBBER BELTING
New and Used h  various alias 1

lengths.
FURNITURE
LOCKER UNITS. T  high, I ’ wide,
3’ deep, w/wood A hail screen doors. 

28 w/12 compartments. 117 w/36 
compartments. 86 w/16 compart­
ments, 7 w/6 compartments, 33 
w/16 compartments, 13 w/4 oow- 
partments.

TRACTOR PARTS
Allis Chalmers, International and 

Case, small quantity.

BUCYRUS ROAD 
MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT

Parts Limited Supply

INDUSTRIAL, TRACTOR 
AND PASSENGER TIRES
22 Industrial 17x5x12%, condition 

good.
1 Solid rubber, 20x5x16, good.

20 Industrial, 21x5x15. new.
6 Industrial, 15x7x11%, good.
4 Industrial, 15x5x11%, good.

10 Industrial, 15x3%, good.
13 NEW TRUCK TUBES, 825x20.
2 Firestone tractor tires, 1300x24,

8 plv, good.
1 Tractor tire, 1275x24, 8 ply, Fire­

stone, poor.
2 Tractor tires, 8x24. 4 ply, poor.
9 Passenger tires, 650x16, 4 ply,

poor.
19 Passenger tires, 700x16, poor.
4 Passenger tires, 650x20, poor.
4 Passenger tires, 700x20, poor.

18 Truck tires, 825x20, 16 ply, poor.
21 Truck tires, 825x20, 16 ply, poor.

HRE FIGHTING EQUIPMENT
FIRE HOSE
FIRE EXTINGUISHERS, Chemical 

& Water
NEW FIRE PLUGS, Small quantity
INSULATING MATERIALS
M « Roll,. T A R PA U L IN  PAPER, 

water proof. Type C, sine 15'x60’

INDUSTRIAL
PLUMBING INSULATON
198 FL 8” Pipe insulation, 2%”  thick 

in 2 layers moulded 85% magnesia 
in heavy canvas, 3' sections.

367 Ft. 6” Pipe insulation, 2 molds 
1%” thick rack of 85% magnesia.
.T sections.

186 Ft. 10” Asbestos pips covering, 
corrugated type, 16 layers 2” 
thick. Canvas covered. 3' roll 
sections. New.

166 Ft. %”  Pipe asbestos insulation,
8 ply, air cell, 1 %”  thick. 3' 
sections split.

81 Ft. 2” Asbestos pipe covering 2” 
thick, canvas covered, 3' roll 
sections, split, new.

168 Ft. 3” Pipe covering. 2* thick, 
canvas covered. S' roll sec­
tions, split, new.

93 Ft. 4” Pipe covering, 1 %”  thick,
3' roll sections, canvas cow­
ered. 3' rolls, new.

46 FL 1%” Pipe asbestos covering,
3' roll sections, 1%”  thick, 
canvas covered, new, shelf- 
worn.

135 Ft. %” Pipe covering. S' roll sec­
tions, canvas covered, flat 
layers, 1* .thick, new, shelf- p
worn.

61 Ft. 2" Asbestos pipe covering, 2”  
thick, canvas covered. 3' rofl 
sections, split, tJtelf worn.

162 Ft. 1%” Asbestos pipe covering 
sir cell. 8 ply, 1%” thick, 3' 
roll sections, canvas covered, 
new. shelf worn.

■6 FL 1 %” Asbestos pipe r vering,
3' sections. 1%” thick, spttft 
flat layers, shelf worn.

lfi# FL Asbestos pipe wrapping, ahr 
cell 8 layers for %”  pipe. 
1%” thick, canvas wrapped,
*' rolls, split, shelf worn.

23 FL Asbestos, pipe covering 4 Ph  
sir cell 1" thick for T”  pipe,
3' sections, spliL new, shelf

F A C T S  Y O U  S H O U L D  K N O W
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Government Sales Outlin ed By W A A
War Assets Offer GFs 
Business Opportunities

“THE ADMINISTRATOR SHALL PRESCRIBE REGU­
LATIONS TO EFFECTUATE THE OBJECTIVES OF THIS 
ACT TO AID VETERANS IN THE ACQUISITION OF 
SURPLUS PROPERTY, IN APPROPRIATE QUANTITIES 
AND TYPES. TO ENABLE THEM TO ESTABLISH AND 
MAINTAIN THEIR OWN SMALL BUSINESS, PROFES­
SIONAL, OR AGRICULTURAL ENTERPRISES."

The above is an extract from the Manasco Bill titled H. R. 6157
In The House of Representatives as of August 16, 1946. It probably 
best explains the War Assets Administration working plan in relation 
to the ex-GI’s purchasing of surplus materials for future business. 

War Assets’ plans were kicked*
•round like the proverbial step-1. . . . . . .
child after World War H. First the e ^ ^ ^ r n o  p f^ r ^  on hU bld
Treasury Department was given 
the job of selling surplus materials. 
Then the Department of Com­
merce. Next the RFC received an 
assignment of d i s p o s a l  and 
mothered along the idea, along 
with their lending provisions, un­
til March of this year when the 
War Assets Administration was 
established. Since then H has be­
come a legitimate business enter­
prise, welcomed by the veteran, 
small business man and others 
alike.

Today the Regional Office in 
Fort Worth has set new ideals and 
precedents for other regional of­
fices to follow. The personnel of 
the Veterans Division is mann'ed 
by more than 95 per cent veter­
ans. Only women employees keep 
it from being 100 per cent ex-GI’s. 
These workers talk the language 
of the veteran and the Division 
holds an enviable record in Amer­
ica for a job well done.

Despite some comment to the 
contrary, purchasing surplus com­
modities from the Government is 
a simple procedure.

Each veteran of. World War II 
has been granted a priority for 
surplus materials, of every con­
ceivable description, up to a maxi­
mum -buying power of $25,000. 
This sum may be okehed through 
the closest regional office. Larger 
sums must be approved by Wash­
ington, D.C., officials. The veter­
an is second in priority only to the 
Federal Government demands for 
emergency equipment.

The GI should send a photo­
stat copy of his honorable dis­
charge from service to the closest 
regional office, along with a letter 
outlining his desires in equipment. 
Never send the original discharge 
to anyone, unless by military or­
ders.

Upon receipt of the photostat 
and requisition of items desired, 
the office issues a certificate en­
titling the veteran to purchase, 
with priority, surplus materials 
from any site-sale or from stocks 
in varied warehouses. As pur­
chases are made by the veteran, 
certificates are endorsed in the 
amount of purchase until the max­
imum figure has been used. How­
ever, officials add, if additional

acceptances. Under Fixed Price 
Sales, priorities are recognized.

All sales under 'Olar Assets Ad­
ministration are for cash. However, 
WAA has a credit department 
where 30-day time is given if 
terms and conditions are met

If veterans do not have suffi­
cient cash to purchase surplus 
commodities and their banks have 
turned down their loan applica­
tions with which to purchase such 
items, the ex-GI should contact 
his closest RFC office for loans 
with which to purchase desired 
surplus commodities. First, how­
ever, the veteran should be certi 
fled to purchase such items.

In other words, here is the pro­
cedure: Take or mail a photostat 
copy of an honorable discharge to 
the Fort Worth or closest WAA 
Regional office; upon receipt of 
your certificate of purchase you 
are ready to receive catalogs and 
notifications of sales; make an'In­
spection of materials wanted at 
the site; attend the site-sale, pick 
out items wanted: pay for items; 
notify method of shipment desired; 
go into business. If credit is de­
sired, take certificate of purchas 
ing ability to RFC and arrange 
loan terms.

Each catalog has an order blank, 
listing articles for sale, where lo­
cated and when offered for sale. 
The “ first come-first served" idea 
is fair to all vets. It insures each 
GI getting what he wants in turn. 
However, many new, unused items 
are offered from time to time as 
they arrive in the United States 
from foreign ports. Catalogs list 
these items, f.o.b. ports. The Vet 
need not visit this site to inspect 
new articles as he gets what the 
catalog lists. He must, however, 
pay freight or express from the 
port to his home town.

One of the biggest site sales to 
date will be held in Amarillo be­
ginning Oct. 28. It is an excellent 
oportunity for G I’s to purchase 
supplies for business.

No sales are conducted on Sat­
urday or Sundays.

All prospective buyers are urged 
to visit the site of the sale and in­
spect offered items prior to open­
ing day unless items are advertised 
as new and unused.

Most of West Texas veterans

JIMMY MOORE and DON C. BOYD examine articles in the 
warehouse stock offered ex-veterans at the Pantex Site Sale In 
Amarillo, Texas.

surplus materials are needed by 
the GI, additional certificates may should contact the Fort Worth 
be secured by starting over again. | WAA Regional offices. This re- 

All certificates are dated. The 8io"al headquarters accommodates 
oldest certificate in the files has veterans to and including Tarrant 

|l first choice of desired items f o r  County on the East; to Crockett 
sale. In this manner it is “ first County on the south; Crane Coun- 

, come—first served." | ^  » " d wei 4 ^pton County
: ,,  . . ... . ,._should report to the Dallas Re-
• Veterans may either visit the . { off£  #11 Oklahoma vet-

Reg.onai WAA office or write the * to Tulsa; all New Mexico
• officials. In either event the photo- etg to j ^ y ^  Colo. However.
!J **at **** honorable dis- office receiving your request
. charge should be brought or mailed wif] prornptly transfer it to the

to the tr-tjional office. In the same nnH notifv the vet
letter tell what items are desired. 
With 72 hours he will receive a 
certificate authorizing him to make 
purchases, either from catalog 
prices or at site-sales.

From that day forward the 
veteran receives lints of all 
future sales u n t i l  he has 
bought all his desired Items, 
reached his maximum pur­
chases of I25.IM, has asked 
to be dropped from the mail­
ing list, or increased his maxi­
mum purchase priority.
Each purchase, whatever the 

amount, will be endorsed upon the 
veteran’s certificate. In this man­
ner the G I’s bookkeeping record 
matches WAA records.

The Federal Government has 
first call on all surplus items. The 
veteran has second call, the small 
business third, state, local and 
non-profit institutions, fourth, and 
the commercial trade levels (the 
small merchant and others) fifth. 
In any event, all classifications 
should write the Fort Worth, Tex- 
as. Regional W AA Office, Texas St 
Pacific Bldg., for complete details. 
In this manner all will receive ex­
act dates and locations of sales, 
.whatever the classification of ma­
terial and merchandise.

There are two methods of W AA 
Bales: Bids and Fixed prices. Bids 
hie opetj to sveryoaa where ratal

proper office and notify the vet 
or business man, within 72 hours, 
of the proper channel of pro­
cedure.

War Assets Administration is a 
legitimate business proposition 
aimed at giving the veteran first 
chance at business, professional 
and agricultural supplies at a fair 
cost, discounted upon the use of 
the Government during war-time 
years, in order the fighting man 
may have an equal opportunity of 
meeting commercial competition in 
a post-war era.

All fair thinking men and 
women should appreciate the 
method and business acumen 
WAA officials are using in carry­
ing out ideas Congress intended 
when it passed the law.

Now WAA has expanded its 
business ethics. The whole princi­
ple and idea of Congress at last 
appears to be reaching the channel 
it was originally intended. It mere­
ly remains for the veteran, small 
business and commercial levels of 
trades, to cooperate and make their 
demands known.

West Texas Grabs 
State Fair Honors

West Texas took advantage of 
its resources officially to open the 
Texas State Fair in a blaze of 
glory. From early morning to late 
at night an estimated 50,000 West 
Texans blared forth cheers and 
other noise to tell a record at­
tendance crowd of the merits 
“West of the Trinity River." Lub­
bock boosters could find nothing 
undone when the famed Tech 
Raiders defeated the touted SMU 
Ponies 7 to 0 to climax an event­
ful day.

An all-time attendance record 
was chalked up opening way when 
more than 175,000 people crowded 
through the gates at Fair Park. 
Officials said it set a new high 
attendance mark for all state fairs. 
It was impossible for visitors to 
see the entire fair in one day and 
night. Old-timers say it will re­
quire a minimum of three days “ to 
get around to all events."

There Hereford (Deaf Smith 
County), Texas, exhibit took spot­
light honors in the Agricultural 
Building under the expert direc­
tion of Byrle Elliston and Sank 
Ramey. Elliston, a veteran ex­
hibitor at State Fairs throughout 
America and a true pioneer of the 
Texas exposition, talked himself 
hoarse on opening day telling the 
highlights of the Texas Panhandle 
and specifically Hereford, “The 
Town Without a Toothache." Here­
ford’s exhibit was the only one 
making the coveted picture rep­
resentation in The Dallas News.

From Spearman on the north to 
the Rio Grande Valley on the 
south, West Texas products stole 
the shdw and the Fair.

More than 30,000 4-H boys and 
girls, from all over Texas, 
stormed the Fair’s opening day 
program and as one cheered 15- 
year-old Ronny Fee, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. R. F. Fee, of Colorado 
City, whose T-O Ranch bloodline 
Herefords, Diamond L  Special and 
TO-Win, won grand champion­
ship and reserve championship re­
spectively.

Clarendon, Texas, FFA Chapter 
won attendance honors.

Of human interest appeal, even 
to the most cynical reporter, was 
15-year-old Gene Duke and his 
$12 Poland China barrow. Gene’s 
mother and brother were drowned 
in the recent flood near San An­
tonio. Gene, his sister and his pig 
were saved. The barrow placed 
eighth at the opening day judg­
ing and many believe the bruised 
and lame pig will claim top sales 
honors before the auctions here 
have ended.

Veteran— Yeah, I  onoe pal a! 
moat thraa hundred aaaa out at
actio*.

Youngster—Gee, Ain 't jam get 
a medal?

.vaiano x wag n o p  too*.

Credit Offered 
On W AA Sales

Wherever credit serves as a 
practical means to increase the 
sale of government-owned surplus 
property. War Assets Administra­
tion is prepared to handle the 
transaction on a normal commer­
cial basis according to Hamilton 
Morton, regional director of the 
Fort Worth WAA office.

If it has been customary for a 
purchaser to use any form of credit 
facility in buying at his normal 
level q f trade, WAA will make 
similar facilities available to those 
who want to avail themselves of 
the materials offered for sale.

Credit will be extended directly 
by WAA. All credit must be estab­
lished before purchases can be 
made on this basis and the facili­
tate the establishment of credit, 
B. X  Winder has been installed as

FORMER GI’s 
INTERVIEW VETS

FT. WORTH. TKX. (W N S ).-  
Kasl Wallace, ex-Anne Col­
onel. Is a typical Gt officer. 
When he became associated 
with War Assete Administra­
tion. after the war, he was as­
signed to the Fort Worth re­
gional offloe as Chief of the 
Veterans' Division. He promptly 
saw that all male personnel was 
made up of former GI’s. He 
even prefers WACt, WAVK8 
and Marines over other female 
workers. Therefore, he has a 
group of more than 95 per cent 
veterans in his division, who 
can talk GI language.

But Colonel Wallace had an­
other idea. "Take WAA to the 
Veteran Instead of their com­
ing to us,” waa his motto. It Is 
paying off. In fact, other re­
gional WAA offices are follow­
ing his idea, with results.

He worked ooi the plan of 
sending oapable teams Into the 
area his office served, such as 
recruiting teams visited towns 
during the war. These team of­
ficials visit certain cities on cer­
tain dates. Veterans are invited 
to bring their discharge papers, 
or a photostat, meet the team, 
become certified for the priv­
ilege of buying sarplus ma­
terials. and thus save costly and 
lengthy journeys over the state.

Red tape has been pared to 
the core. Only one application 
blank is signed. Within 72 hours 
the Veteran has been certified 
to buy whatever he want*. The 
rost Is kept at a minimum and 
everyone Is satisfied.

Two weeks ago the WAA 
team visited Wichita Falls, in­
terviewed 112 veterans and Is­
sued 85 purchasing certificates. 
It saved these G I’s costly trips 
to Dallas. Ft. Worth, Tulsa and 
other offices.
. W. L. “ Roy" Wei I bo me. a 
one-man team, will visit San 
Angelo Oct. 22-23; Big Spring. 
Oct 24; Brownwood. Oct. 29; 
and Abilene Oct. 30-31.

James L. Adkins and Melvin 
M. Calvin will make up the 
team for WAA visiting Wichita 
Falls. Oct. 22-24; Amarillo. Oct. 
20-30; and Lubbock, Oci. 31 and 
Nov. 1.

Veterans of surrounding areas 
are urged to contact these WAA 
representatives, tell of their 
purchasing desires and become 
certified as Veteran customers. 
All are urged to bring original 
or photostat of honorable dis­
charge from service when meet­
ing the team.

The WAA will do the rest In 
seeing each veteran, small busi­
ness man or others have oppor­
tunity for surplus bargains, a 
plan which Is aimed at starting 
new businesses, retarding Infla­
tion and assisting an eager In­
dustrial America planning the 
future.

Chief of the Credit Division in the 
WAA office in Fort Worth. Pros­
pective purchasers may select any 
type of credit preferred, including 
open credit account, sight draft 
or letter of credit issued through a 
bank.

“To give credit where credit is 
due," Morton added, “ the WAA 
Credit Division will explain va­
rious credit systems to those who 
are interested in making purchases 
from WAA anywhere in the United 
States and charge such purchases 
to their account, paying 90 days 
from the dale of invoke,*

Amarillo First 
O f Site Sales

By W. U. McCOY 
(WNS Feature WrUer)

AMARILLO. T E X .  (W NS).-* 
The biggest “bargain counter” in 
Texas will open its doors at 9 a. m. 
October 28, as veterans from “all 
over” flock to the War Assets Ad­
ministration site sale at Pantex 
Ordnance Plant, near Amarillo.

Western News Service attended 
a “sneak preview" of the sale, see­
ing a play-by-play process of the 
buyer in action. Jimmy Moore, 
18th District Commander of the 
American L e g i o n ,  was “put 
through the paces” by Don C. 
Boyd, Field Director in charge of 
site sales at the plant.

We learned, among other things, 
that Pantex has developed a 
unique control system which gives 
the purchaser an immediate check 
on availability of items. Labels 
and descriptions in the display 
rooms are corrected promptly as 
stock levels change. As soon as the 
buyer visits the display room and 
fills in his purchase order, the doc­
ument control section can quickly 
tell him the quantity available, and 
his order is correctly filled out on 
the spot.

No prospective purchaser is al­
lowed to see stock items before a 
sale, and all buyers have an even 
break at getting the items they 
want when they visit the display 
rooms, Mr. Boyd emphasized.

First step at the site sale is the 
reception desk, where order forms 
are received. Back of the desk is a 
large diagram of the various dis­
play rooms, and the buyer is en­
abled to proceed quickly to the 
category he has selected to choose 
from. He joins a small group and 
is conducted to the display rooms.

The Vet comes to the sale with 
a certificate that allows him to 

| purchase from special item-groups 
he has selected, or he might be 
certified for up to $25,000 in gen- 

|eral merchandise. He may decide 
to spend only part of this amount 
and get an inter-regional sales 
certificate and attend sales in other 
areas.

Our ‘buyer" was interested in 
textiles and fan and conveyor 
belts, the belts being listed under 
"general products and miscellane­
ous." A salesman was waiting at 
each of these display rooms to 
answer his questions and help him 
fill in the order. Complete descrip­
tions of all articles were found on 
sheets below the merchandise, 
with quantities available, prices 
and whether available singly or in 
lots. Textile displays contained 
coats, hats, gloves, shoe laces, rub­
ber and leather shoes—even sew­
ing thread.

In the general products room, 
fan and conveyor belts were easily 
found; in fact, every kind of end­
less belt imaginable was displayed 
on a large panel at one side of the 
room. Our mechanically-minded 
buyer was tempted by a number 
of items here, but he was anxious 
to get to the document control 
section with his purchase order.

This next stop, the Validation 
and Inventory control, quickly 
checked his purchase order against 
stock on hand and found no change 
necessary in his order. This con­
trol system is a Pantex develop­
ment and will be used in the 
forthcoming sale. This system af­
fords a quick and immediate check 
on the purchase order.

On the way to the cashier the 
buyer saw signs above the doors 
of other display rooms: Kitchen 
equipment, furniture, electrical 
and plumbing, hand tools, office 
supplies, contractors’ equipment, 
safety equipment, heating stoves, 
hardware and general merchan­
dise.

Receipts were already filled out 
when our buyer reached the cash­
ier, and the transaction was quick­
ly completed.

A couple of windows down, un­
der a sign reading “ traffic," the 
buyer was asked for details on 
shipping the merchandise he had 
bought. He decided to ship by 
truck and gave the consignment 
address. And that was it. Easier 
than shopping in a super-market. 
But what a super-market!

Veteran site sales will start 
Monday, October 28, and continue 
through Friday, Nov. 1, according 
to Field Director Don C. Boyd. 
There will be no sales over Satur­
day and Sunday. On Monday, Not. 
4, RFC will buy for small busi­
nesses; sale will be held for state 
and local government on Nov. 5; 
non-profit organizations (such m  
preventoriums and children's 
homes) will buy on Nov. 6; begin­
ning Nov. 7 and 8, large and smaft 
businesses will buy at retail and 
wholesale trade levels.

/
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Let's Take Stock
Farmers of the vast Southwest should be as interested

as anyone in loans Uncle Sam proposes to make to foreign 
nations. They should also know as much about H as any­
one as very few fnrmcrs exist who have not, at one time or 
another, dealt with banks while seeking loans.

That our nation's affairs are in a mess is not denied by 
any straight-thinking citizen. Many of us have recollections 
of when our hanks were in a similar position.

Did the hanks allow us loans withoift security when they 
were suffering? Did they tell us to name the amount we 
wanted when we were suffering?

They did not!
Usually good collateral was not sufficient for us to secure 

the loan we needed. Usually the hankers wanted depositors 
to sign notes with us to secure seed money or repair funds. 
They called that good business.

Kngland is our Ally, it is admitted. Perhaps France, and 
a few other countries could he called friends. If Russia is 
our friend, it has not been proven. Yet we are called upon 
to make staggering loans to many nations; to feed them 
while we lend them money. Farmers of America will carry 
the burden in both instances because no loan is worth the 
pa|K'r it is writteu on without security and America’s land 
still remains the best collateral under Heaven.

Isn’t it time to take stock? Shouldn’t these nations want­
ing our food and cash be willing to secure payment with a 
few things we need; things such as protective bases, ex­
change of commodities, a pro ratio bargaining account with 
other sources of trade?

Good Driving
Civic clubs, other organizations, newspa|>ers and pro­

gressive individuals are usually seeking some sponsored 
campaign of benefit to the general public. The thought 
occurs to us it might be a good idea to teach people how 
to drive automobiles.

With all car manufacturers working day and night to 
supply the cur-hungry nation with transportation and with
unprecedented highway programs on the docket, arteries of 
traffic the next few years will be jammed and packed with 
cars. Only a small percentage of the drivers will be as ex­
perienced as officers hope for. Too many will be driving 
for the first time. If these drivers arc trained, accidents will 
be low. On the other hand, if untrained speed demons take 
the wheel, deaths and accidents will mount.

Any teen-age youth knows a car will run just as fast as 
you push down on the accelerator. Few know how to drive 
slow, the rules of heavy traffic, courtesy of the highway.

Any group devoting time and instruction to new drivers, 
to where the State Highway Police will issue driver’s license, 
will he doing a benefit to the state and nation. Further­
more, state and local officers will cooperate in such a 
planned program for the asking.

A striking thing about West j importance of Uic individual vote. 
Texas, Western Oklahoma and A pessimistic local man said there 
Eastern New Mexico is the recur— was no need to go to the polls, 
ring example of city, county and none of the candidates were any 
state government spending and good. Shelton replied, “ Well, go 
working to beautify and make the to the polls and vote anway. Vote 
community and country at large a for the best no-good candidate.' 
comfortable and pleasant place to 
live . . . pride in history and inter­
est in the perpetuation of old land­
marks, shrines—the old Sweetwat­
er Chuckwagon that fed the boys

Shine Phillips has done a lot of 
research and writing on the history 
of this region, and he thinks the 
John Gunther condensation (July 

on the D-Z Ranch, restoration of i Reader’s Digest) is one of the best 
Fort Davis . . . small communities j Texas descriptions he has seen, 
with capable leaders, working, I Philips is spending his vacation at 
giving their time to carry out home in Big Springs this year,
youth programs for character, 
health, devoted to the kind of rec­
reation the youngsters enjoy . , . 
communities with free swimming 
pools, built from county funds . . . 
communities working together un­
selfishly toward common goals, 
hospitals, lake projects .. . Roman­
esque poplars, bordering a high-

puttering around,” and working 
on a new book, to be called “This 
Can’t Happen Again.”

Big Spring appreciates her writ­
ers and artists, and there are sev­
eral. The old adage about the 
prophet being disregarded in his 
own‘ town probably flourished be­
cause the poet-artist-novelist tried

way leading out of a city . . .  a to perpetuate the “ ivory tower” 
countryside dotted with roadside legend. Shine Phillips, Jessie 
parks, designed for use, with trav- ; Thomas, Helen Reagan Smith, and 
elers stopping to rest or have a tencher-poet George Metzell are as 
picnic lunch, leaving the place as civic-minded as they come. They

don’t fold their hands after their 
writing is done; they still have 
time to be prominent, active mem­
bers in community life.

The late H. W. Kaylor, Big 
Harry Shelton, in the Rotan Ad- Spring artist, is thought by many 

vance, has the right idea. He wrote critics to rank with Remington for 
an editorial in his paper on the | the tone and finish of his work.

clean as they found it, showing 
their awareness and approval of 
the individual’s role in the scheme 
of things.

R E G I O N A L
R O U N D - U P
HIGHLIGHTS of the Tri-State 

Area for the next few days:
Oct. 24-26: Fisher County Fair A 

Hereford Show, Roby, Texas.
Oct. 26: Mitchell County Better 

Baking Program, Colorudo City, 
Texas.

Oct. 26: Floyd County 4-H Club 
Achievement Day and Pig Show, 
Floydada.

T R I - S T A T E
T A T T L E R

By BILL COX

Eat

PRAIRIE DOG PETE SEZ:

•nly on tangible Meets. We tried

DID YOU read where the gov­
ernment says we should have $1150 
per person earned income for the 
past year? Did you get yours? 
This don't mean for the whole 
blamed family hut each for Ma, 
Pa, Sis, Bud, and Granps. Well, 
we didn’t get our share and we 
know lots of folks who didn’t. 
What we want to know is what us 
guys who got about half that 
amount is gonna do now that in­
flation is with us. We went to see 
our banker about this difference in 
rash ownership but he wasn’t In­
terested. what with our over-draft 
and all. He said our assets were 
intangible; that we couldn't borrow 

is figure out what he meant. The
close*! we came to It was to believe our money in the bank is tangi­
ble assets (usually being loaned to some other guy) and what we had 
to borrow on was Intangible. No wonder American banks have more 
deposits 'ban ever before in history. The bankers intend to keep It, 
too. Dot i know why they don’t Just pick a banker to represent ns In 

Europe, A t could pay no even quicker than Joe Stalin.

OTTO LAWSON, Knox City. 
Texas, recently set a new record 
at Lake Kemp by catching a 38- 
pound drum.

SIDNEY REEVES, former super­
intendent of schools at Petersburg, 
Texas, is the new secretary of the 
Dimmitt Chamber of Commerce.

CABOT has purchased a govern­
ment owned carbon black plant in 
Guymon, Okla.

BOB ROBERTSON of Matador 
has opened the most swell-elegant 
eating place in West Texas. The 
oply trouble is a visitor can’t get 
is there to eat. The home folks 
are storming the place.

BAIRD, TEXAS, is building a 
new Legion Hut, plans a new bank, 
and is fixing up right of way bonds 
for U. S. highway 80 this month.

MORTON, TEXAS, is busy this 
month what with warning' live­
stock owners to keep their crit­
ters in check, seeking cotton pick­
ers, etc., and cleaning up after 
their first norther and fall sand 
storm.

CLARENDON, TEX., the city wc 
believe to be the champion cattle, 
hog and agricultural producer of 
the area, devotes all of its front 
page nows in the Donley County 
Leader to such events. We have 
reached the point where if some­
one wins a livestock award, we 
want to know what part of Clar­
endon he lives in.

HOBART, OKLA., wants news­
paper files pertinent to that area 
prior to 1917, Mrs. John Gleason 
so states in a public announcement 
and adds the city had five papers 
before the town was 30 days old.

LORATNE, TEX., Legionnaires 
are also building a new hut and 
its editor, J. W. KING, Sr., predicts 
inflated prices are carrying Amer­
ica on a wild ride which must lead 
to a “bust,’*

IMPOSSIBLE and ALTOGETH­
ER UNBELIEVABLE: A tooth­
ache in Hereford, the town with­
out ’em,

OBJECT OF EXTENSIVE KID­
DING: Max Wade, Groom News 
publisher, whose wife sometime 
bock beat him in the Justice of 
the Peace race. Bet he’s the most 
overruled, over-fined guy in the 
state. An argument with the little 
woman might result in a con­
tempt of court charge.

VILA ACUNA: That little Mexi­
can border town where everyone 
in Del Rio goes to eat. A lot of 
Del Rio dinner dates happen every 
night out of the United States.

FROM A SOUTHERN BELLE, 
South Caroline that is, who prob­
ably thinks Senator Claghorn is a 
descendant of Lee: “ Why good­
ness. you all, yo’ wife certainly 
doesn’t look like a Mexican.” She 
had reference to a Dixie boy’s 
new wife, who hailed originally 
from Tucuincari, N. M.

M

Editor’s Note: Recipes for the 
“Let’s Eat" column should be sub­
mitted to the Cooking Editor, Box 
2347, Amarillo, Texas. One dollar 
will be paid for each recipe upon 
publication.

That great little guy, Ernie 
Pyle, once said: “You can always 
tell an Oklahoma, New Mexico or 
Texas boy. They talk slower and 
more casually, are more down-to- 
earth and friendly than any other 
American.”

Ernie might have added the gals 
from these parts have got some­
thing. too. Because of these pure­
bred beauties, many a GI with a 
Joisy brogue or a sun-kissed Cali­
fornia look disinherited the East 
and the Glamour State to become 
a nationalized citizen of the Tri- 
State area. What I would like to 
know is which, if one is superior, 
turns out Ihe best-looking babes? 
Probably the Gallup Poll would 
take off at a trot and call it a 
draw.

The favorite recipe of Mrs. 
W. T. Holland, Canyon, Texas, 
is for Hamburger Pie. Here's 
how she makes It.

HAMBURGER PIE
1 small onion
2 tablespoons fat
1 pound hamburger
1 small can tomatoes or tomato 

puree.
Biscuit dough made from:

2 cups flour
2 tablespoons fat
4 teaspoons baking powder
1 teaspoon salt
% to 1-3 cup milk 

Cut onion fine; saute in fat In 
heavy skillet until yellow. Add 
hamburger meat crumpled. Brown, 
and add tomato. Roll out dough 
and cut Into tiny biscuits. Cover 
top of pie with biscuits, and bake 
in moderately quick oven until 
biscuits are done. This is an eco­
nomical one-dish meal.

Say. that bank robber who 
knocked over the Levelland bank, 
went to a movie, then was cap­
tured shortly after leaving the 
theater, lie probably wasn’t think­
ing much about it at the time, but 
the real climax didn’t come till the 
show was over.

Fifty-eight per cent of the na­
tion’s known gas reserves are in 
Texas.

Mrs. T. Z. Lucas, who lives on 
Meredith Ranch, Route 1, Quin­
lan, Texas, claims lee Box 
Cookies as her favorites. This is 
her recipe.

ICE BOX COOKIES 
1-3 cup brown sugar 
1-3 cup white sugar 
1-2 cup shortening 
1 egg
1 5-6 cups flour 
1-3 teaspoon soda 
1-3 cup nuts 
1 teaspoon vanilla 
Cream shortening and sugar; adc 

egg. Sift flour and measure. Sif 
all dry ingredients together thw 
times, then gradually add to firs 
mixture. Add nuts, vanilla, an* 
form into a roll. Wrap with waxec 
paper, put in Ire box and chill 
When thoroughly chilled, slie 
with sharp knife. Place on grease* 
baking sheet and bake at 350 de 
grees five to ten minutes.

The pecan, officially adopt* 
state tree of Texas, produces e 
annual crop varying from 5,000 
000 to 45,000,000 pounds.

Gold was known to the Indlai
as early as 1564.
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Fate has breathed against the 
flame atop the tall, white can­
dle, left in the twilight of its own 
radiance. Another plane climbs ir.
* £ " »  " M r S i i J K r ?  bull, didn’t know wh.t
» . ^ r t *  inECl & 0,w r  I *» « °  o, the fellows ever did ride a „y of the bulls. I don', know

hi M e r ic . . .  V I. Carrier r i s ^ t  rains for .he p e t  two
weeks over the Tri-State area re­
call to mind the fail of 1924 when 
highways of the Panhandle were
nothing more than lake bottoms, 
drainage ditches for so-called pub­
lic roads, and every traveling 
salesman started off his weekly re­
ports with something like this: 
“Somewhere in a Ditch—”

This writer spent more time that 
year in the ditch between Ama­
rillo and Lubbock than he did in

I have just returned from a bull fight held in a Mexican border 
town and wish to advise if you happen to be a bull you had better 
stay out of Mexico. Since this was my first I cannot evaluate by com­
parison but I  do know border-town fights are strictly bush league 
affairs where only 4-F bulls are used—with fighters to match. And 
I also know the bull has about as much chance as an uninformed 
small investor on Wall Street

Mexican people are addicted to fiestas, love, and bull fights. The 
; last thing a peon pawns is his guitar. Then he spends half the money 
for a ticket to a bull fight. The exhibition failed to “ send” me, how-

—  P A G * t

fy A T ’S 
ALA VER f

By PAT FLYNN

any of the towns en route. Many a
th a t t «  th e  ritarm  *>arth a t i how much experience the fighters had but I  noticed one of them night electrical jtorms entertained
rdIht H?« hv thM ^mnlirht before each thrust would spit on his hands. It would have been a better lho Red Ball bus driver and
night. His smile is in the sunlight and fairer sbow if they had just put two bulls in together for a finish

¥---------------------------------------------------
There were six bulls in all. Four

on little pools left by the rain., .  , . . _ .
Wild prairie flowers nod their no hookl, b® ^
proud heads above the soil pressed1 There were six bulls 
by his boyish feet a few summers °*  them lost and I am happy to re- 
ago and his voice seeps from new port two of them fought to a draw, 
reservoirs of memories. The f la g s  By that I mean .the boysi just 
of all youth are lowered in tribute couldn t take them. After all the 
to his faith, his courage and the flapping of capes and running 
stricken buds of his dreams. A i around, the matador takes the field 
young flier is in the night sky and with a bright red cape and a long 
the movement of his plane’s lights gleaming sword. As the bull rushes 
cease; far, bright and clear amid past him he is supposed to give it 
the stars. Ith* business. Well, on two diffe*-

• • • ! ent fights the matador just wouldn’t
My fears are prowling coyotes punch the bull on the button. He

In the canyon of uncertainty that would call in a helper but the bull 
skirt the fields with which endea- would turn on 4his second mata- 
vor has become familiar. They dor and snort, “ Et tu. Brute?” 
howl with a tone of some unknown making this second guy run back 
misery into the walking fog that for a drink of water. Finally, four 
hurries beneath a melting moon, or five guys would come in on one 
The sound of theft stealthy, pad- bull and fight him on the club 
ded feet is frequently audible just plan.
outside the door of opportunity. One of the bulls slipped and fell

• • • and a matador who had lost his
Profanity leaves a stain on the sword in the rush dashed in with

heart like a piece of white linen a long dirk and began to jab the 
that has been touched by unclean fallen bull like a nervous woman 
hands. I patching a pair of pants. Ah, sport!

• • • ! How loosely thou art translated
Our opinion never has 1-ss value sometimes.

than in that hour when we use its 
worth to effect sclf-appraisaL 

* 0 •
We heard no sound when the old

cowboy rode up betore the cotton- ’ ™ck« upon him by

I am again happy to report that 
after this action the mat&dor had 
to scoot for safety pronto to es­
cape the hail of pop bottles and

hi.i
woods that cast 
l o n g  shadows 
from the morn­
ing sun across 
the rickety ve­
randa. He might 
have a r r i v e d  
from a cushioned 
trail out of the 
skies or drifted in 
on a barge that 
had followed the 
tide of night. He 
sat at ease in the 
saddle with the

admiring public. Before he got to 
sanctuary I counted three hits and 
four near misses. 1 claim one of
the hits.

The arena Is a circle of sand 
150 feet across. This is surrounded 
by wooden bleachers towering 
high with $2.00 seats filled with 
gullible spectators. As an added 
note of culture a Mexican band 
intermittently blared forth dis« 
cordant military tunes. Soda water

Ball bus driver and me 
while we hoped some farmer 
would see us, between flashes, and

■

A N  O K I E 1 
S P E A K S

By JOHH DRAKE. Jr.

50 feet before the picador dives tome to the rescue. I have dug out
more mud from between fenders 
and balloon tires than Mr. Fire- 
store or Goodyear ever considered 
when making them. I have stayed 
in more bowl-and-pitcher hotel 
rooms, where rain beat a rhyth­
mic tune on tin roofs than I care 
to remember. But the yarns I 
picked up from farmers off-set

i u, u n i l . .  i the discomfort of travel. Thu Minelar to certain public buildings not , ^  ^ ason
commonly discussed in mixed com-

for the safety of his fox-hole. The 
bull, sensing a trick, returns toI 
his base in the center of the ring., 

Now these fox-holes are mighty 
handy devioes. They are spaces 
cut in the wall surrounding the 
arena with a wall section set in 
front of them like a protecting 
screen. The construction is simi-

pany, except they are not marked 
“ Men” oh one corner and “ Bulls” 
on the other. It is believed the in­
ventive element in the profession 
is now working on a type of re­
volving door to replace this out­
house construction.

Back in the ring another pica­
dor shakes the dust from his cape,

REMEMBER that year when the 
first freeze came? Recall how the 
lakes of the region froze almost 
solid; how the ’teen-agers learned 
how to ice skate? Those were the 
glorious days. One night a group 
of West Texas State students

A few days ago, while driving 
to Vernon, Texas, I spied a terra­
pin crawling across the highway. I 
ran one wheel off the pavement to 
keep from killing it, only to look 
in the rear view mirror and see 
him smashed to a bloody mass by 
a big truck 50 yards behind.

So do many parents drive off 
the pavement to save their chil­
dren from cold reality, only to 
see them crushed by people who 
care little whether they survive or 
perish along the road of life.

Children can’t be under the pro­
tective wing of a fond parent all 
their lives. There always comes a 
day when they must stand on their 
own feed and make their own de­
cisions. They can be spoiled too 
much. Early in life they should, 
for their own good, be taught to do 
a little work around the home. 
Each should be given some little 
chore to be responsible for each 
day. If they leave to go to col­
lege, petted and pampered without 
ever having had the opportunity 
to shoulder a responsibility, they 
have been cheated by a too fond 
parent.

We men are basically honest. By 
that, I mean we would rather tell 
the truth than a falsehood. But 
when the wife parades out with 
the most ridiculous object on her 
head which she calls a hat, which 
is easier a white he or the truth. . , ... ... . _ ________  raided the chicken house of one

»  hnTl of its group and .had just gotten j followed by the inevitable conse-
t  Iv H ™  l th,  5  ! to the white meat when the sheriff quences?and as promptly dives for safety. ided the creek-side meeting --------

This goes on for quite some time,j aZ , s t  $S e X  But the man who has limited abil-
If it had not been for a faculty ity and aspires to be great spends
member, still with this college, so much time trying to convince

working the bull into a .feeling of 
frustration. The inning closes: no 
hits, no runs, no errors.

Into the arena ride two men on
most of us would have had the the public of his greatness that he
word “ expelled” written by our

horseback. They carry long lances; name. She was understanding. She 
and the horses wear padded metalj begged off for us before the proper 
armor banketing them to the powers and it is one event all of 
knees. The gallant gauchos ride us remember.
up and each in turn punches the 
bull a few times with his lance. 
They are vaccinating him against 
lockjaw and indigestion, I think, 
but the pop vendor explains it 
has to do with “ preparing” the 
bull. It seems that certain pierc-

has no time for worthwhile work.

Tolerance is something most of 
us could use more of. For exam­
ple, the first time you see Old 
Moe Flug you don't like his looks.

That same year brings back an- He needs a shave and haircut and 
other vivid recollection—of having his clothes have a few patches, 
been rotten-egged out of Claren- His English is terrible and he 
don. It seems the Canyon football; swears too much. So you brand 
squad and the Clarendon team him as a no good and shun him 
never met on half-way terms. | like the plague. Later you find

mgs cause the bulls head to drop |Qne team was always trying to ' „ ut he isn't'such an old scoundrel 
exposing and opening a vital spot j stcaI or brand the other-a mascot. I as you though. He is so busy mak-
hunhng^o^the8 matador l Storwf  N? matter.who won the game, the infj a living for a wife and half a nun mg for the matador later on. wlnners always suffered the in- dozen ragged kids he has little

The semi-finals begin after the dignity of being run out of town, 
brave knights have poked their Those were the days.
fill and withdrawn from the field.

Meador
toe of his right boot pressing the thickly over the arena was run- 
stirrup. My father hastened to ask ning a temperature of 103 with 
him to dismount and be welcome.1 lazy breezes pushing it around just 
Breakfast would soon he ready. He enough to make you realize your 
hesitated for a moment, then stood neighbor, also, came too warmly 
beside his horse with a movement dressed. Little did I realize then, 
that belied his evident years.1 in my breathless hush of expecta- 
There was a long Winchester in tion. that the performance too 
the scabbord beneath his saddle1 would stink.
fender. The salt of dried sweat! Trumpets, fanfare and suction 
covered his bridle reins like frost. \ on pop bottles drops 90 per cent 
He spoke but a few words, his as matadors and picadors enter 
large, brown eyes fastened on the, wjth a majestic sweep into this 
vista of green corn and maize, still vast cuspidor below us. “Quince 
wet with dew. Then he asked m y! centavos!” yells the pop vendor, 
father for horse feed. He removed meaning of course “Bring on the

™  U, £  The fighters who enter now a-foot
isn 12^1 ^fiid Th th^  are dressed in brighter and silkierkettle- The « ,r hanging , costumes_ Thjs isbno doubt to dc_

the Winchester and the saddle, 
then dropped the bits from his 
horse’s mouth with delicate care. 
We dumped a large forkful of dried 
maize heads into the manger and 
started to leave but the cowboy 
remained. He shredded the maize 
carefully and tossed out the cen­
ter stems. He could hear my moth­
er calling us to breakfast but he 
would not depart before his horse 
had finished the last bunch of 
brown seeds in the manger.

• • •
Time is like a cup of water

poured into thirsty sand. It vanish­
es with the quickness of a puff of 
smoke, leaving a little moisture as 
brief register of having passed.

• • »
Love Is the rich, sweet wine 

pressed from the fruits of life ’s 
vineyards. Its potency and flavor 
is not, however, greatly improv­
ed with age. • • •

The wolfs whistle frequently 
fascinates a chicken.

0 0 •
Most gravy trains operate on 

uncertain tracks.
• • •

Gossip is a lamp that requires
offensive oil.

• • •
Destiny hews sound lumber from 

the forest of human lives, fre­
quently showing preference to the 
stout, gnarled, storm-tried trees, to 
those which have grown slim, 
graceful and brittle in the protec­
tion of valleys.

Check your lights. Six months 
of driving may diminish the 
strength of your headlights by as 
much as 60 per cent.

bulls!” And at his word a barn 
yard gate swing wide and a be­
wildered bull, batted from behind 
with a two-by-four with a nail 
in it, rushes into the arena.

One of the picadors at the f»r  
side of the arena yoo-hoos at him 
with a flap of his red cape and 
the bull accepts the challenge and 
charges. The distance between the 
bull and man closes to a scant

note they get maybe 25c more per 
hour than the workmen who pre­
viously performed. These gaily- 
clad chaps flap at the bull with 
their red capes and then surprise 
the spectators by not running for 
their fox-holes. Instead, they step 
aside and let the bull rush past. 
The more proficient the fighter, 
the closer he will stand to the 
passing bull. Standing a few inches 
from the bull’s horns is equivalent 
to a long fly that hits the right 
field fence in a more sporting 
event which Mexico is also trying 
out this year.

This farce goes on until it is 
quite clear the crowd will stand 
for it no longer. Then the great 
matador takes the field with his 
gleaming sword concealed in his 
cape. The bull, thinking this new­
comer just wants to play like the 
others, lowers his head and 
charges into the Valley of Death.

There is a moral here if you 
care to pick it out.

time for personal appearance.
That doesn’t mean you are duty 

bound to invite Old Moe to your 
house. Maybe you have nothing is 
common and you would both be

We had Juvenile delinquency
even in those days, too. Singing _______ ^___ _______
“Ja Da, Ja Da Jing Jing Jing, i j|| at case, but when you see him 
wasn’t so bad. but when the boys on the street don’t be ashamed to 
started buying a certain brand o f . raise your hand and say, “Hi, 
Lemon Extract, because of its po- 1 Moe.”
tent alcoholic content,' the parents 
arose in arms, the extract was 
banred from grocery shelves and 
the young folk became more tem­
perate.

The Bronc-Buster Says:
By BOB MOORK

haveSome of the cowboys are wondering if they are going to 
anything left to ride if folks keep on consuming horse meat.

Times really change. Once, Old Paint was the King of the Range. 
Now he’s a substitute for a beefsteak.

Not having feasted on this delicacy, we asked some of our Eastern 
friends what it was like. They report that horse meat turns a red 
color in the cooking stage and has a ’■sweet” tasto. Not really bad 
eating, they said. Want to try some?

• • 0
Regional folks will enjoy reading “The Farmer Takes a Wife,1* a 

slim book by John Gould, even though there is a lot of difference 
between farming in Maine and farming in this area.

In addition to being a farmer, Mr. Gould is editor of a newspaper 
published at Lisbon Falls, Maine.
* Here’s a quotation from the book which the Reader's Digest calls 
“a refresher course in humanity."

“Probably nobody ever stopped to count the parts to a cream sepa­
rator, but they run high. Besides the spout and things, they have a 
million (more or less) little conical disks that slip inside the other. 
To get disk 35 in where disk 28 should go is bad business. The milk 
wouldn’t know where to go go if the numbers weren’t right.”

If you've a “born trader”  in your family you’ll be interested in 
learning how a Maine neighbor went to the State Fair with nothing 
but a jack knife, and came back (after getting boot every trade) with 
a pair of roans, a cart with a bull toed to the tail-gate, chums, logging 
tools, storm windows, chains, and a big brass cage for a parrot And 
he had $17 in his podoet, papers tor the bull, and eight jack knives, 
including his

All of this merely brings to mind 
what may happen this winter. The 
lakes may freeze over and a new 
generation will learn ice skating 
for the first time. Wheat has good 
seasoning, there is none of the 
lemon extract to worry about, but 
what about the chicken feasts? The 
OPA has ruined our chances of

Setting picnic meats from the 
utcher. Adults beat the young­

sters to the counters looking for 
the dinner menu. Chicken coops 
are not so easy to raid as 20 years 
years ago; teachers not so under­
standing.

The laboring man is as neces­
sary to our country as the busi­
ness executive, and a lot more es­
sential than some so-called “big 
shots” I could name.

However, there is one improve­
ment for which we are grateful: 
while we had to learn a popular 
hit, “ I ’ve Got to Cool My Doiggies 
Now,” we didn’t have to learn how 
to sing and dance to “Concrete 
Mixer,” a jive of noise now popu­
lar which no linguist has as yet 
been able to translate into the 
English language.

Current Daffynitions
BACTERIA: Rear of Cafeteria.
JANITOR: A floor-flusher.
POLITICAL PIE: Mixture of 

plums and applesauce.
TOBACCO: Lettuce with a sun­

tan.
CONSCIENCE: Something that 

makes you tell your wife before 
someone else does.

MAIN STREET CAD: A chap 
refusing to cheat on his wife.

WAITER: A guy who believes 
money grows on trays.

GOLF & PARKING: Smack a 
pill and walk:

UNO: What a girl says to a guy 
in the back seat of a cab.

POLITICAL WAR: Everyone 
shooting from the lip.

THE OLDER generation thought 
nothing of rising at 6 a. m. And, 
we don’t think much of it either.

I HATE to open my mail every 
morning. Every day I receive in­
vitations from kinsmen, in-laws 
and other casual acquaintances 
who have married, graduated, di­
vorced, had babies, birthdays or 
anniversaries. A gift is in order 
for each one, my wife says, and I 
know better than to argue with 
her. No wonder I'm always over­
drawn at the bank.

IT SEEMS I bought my sixth 
cousin by marriage a present for 
being born only three or four 
years ago and the other day I re­
ceived a graduation announce­
ment, wedding invitation and no­
tice of a stork shower all within a 
week. I give up!

GRANDPA Drake had 13 mouths 
to feed and he has my sympathy. 
I am a poor mathematician. No 
matter how I plan my budget I 
discover at the end of the month 
my outgo has always exceeded my 
income.

EVERY writer strives for orig­
inality. I have reached the conclu­
sion there are no original ideas 
left. Too many millions of people 
have lived before us. Every time 
I think I have hit upon something 
new to write about I find later 
that Plato, Shakespeare or Ben 
Johnson used the same idea hun­
dreds of years ago. I guess I was 
born about 1,000 years too late.

THE FORGOTTEN man of the 
age is the American farmer. There 
seems to be a ceiling on every­
thing he tries to market. What we 
need is a floor under the livestock 
he raises. The candidates who con­
vince me they will try to do some­
thing for our forgotten man gets 
my vote.

I  CAN NOT understand why ao 
many non-veterans rush to buy 
and wear surplus army clothes. 
They sure were allergic to then 
during the war.
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Publishers Strive to 
Boost Their Community

And He Lived 
With A ll Four

Acknowledgment to 
NON TIMES

IjOld Freighter Recalls I  
Early Days in Southwesi

fcl) SC HNEIDER

TUCUMCARI, N. M. (WNS).— 
Ed Schneider and Mrs. Dillon 
Suthers, co-publishers of the Tu- 
cumcari American and Sunday 
Leader, have as their journalistic 
aim “ to do something worthwhile 
for the community every year.” 

They advocated a housing pro­
gram in 1944 and succeeded in ob­
taining a government allotment of 
40 housing units.

In the spring of 1945, they 
launched a campaign to get a city
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MRS. DILLON HI THERS

But Mrs. Suthers was deter­
mined to continue publication of 
the paper.

“She learned to operate the 
Linotype herself,”  Schneider said, 
“ami she’s carried on ever since.” i

Mrs. Suthers came to Tucumcari 
with her parents in 1910. She 
finished school here. Her father, 
Dr. O. E. Brown, is still an active 
physician in Tucumcari.

Hi Suthers, who was a well- 
known New Mexico newspaper- I

manager for People | --.Pu rchased  the Amencan back
of this New Mexico town were n v
stirred to action by news stories 
and editorials in the American, 
and by December the issue had 
come to a vote.
First <’lty Manarer

It w as carried, and in April of 
this year, John H. Bender came 
here is Tucumcari’s first city
maiiueer.

Currently, the Tucumcari Pub­
lishing Co. is sponsoring a cour­
tesy contest, which, if the com

Becomes Manager
Schneider became manager of 

the American in October, 1943,. He 
bought half interest in the paper 
in August, 1945.

The Sunday Leader is a com- 
paritively new publication. It was 
born in March of this year. The 
combined staff of both papers to­
tals 13 employees.

Typical of Mrs. Suther’s and 
Schneider’s attitude toward their 
work is the special irrigation edi-

QUANAH. TEX. (W NS).— 
Quanah Parker, chief of the 
Comanches, was an interesting 
character in the early days of 
West Texas and Oklahoma. 
Many old-timers were close 
friends of the Indian and many 
unusually interesting events are 
associated with the Red man.

He adopted the white man’s 
ways to a large extent and built 
a nice home in Oklahoma on 
the reservation. However, he 
often visited here and in Ver­
non in the 80's.

It is said of him that after 
finishing his home, his old 
friends wanted to make him a 
nice present of something to 
decorate his home. They asked 
him what he desired. Quanah 
studied a moment and said: “A 
desk. When white man eome in 
me blow smoke in his face and 
say, ‘Me heap busy’.”

Another yarn told on the In­
dian happened when President 
Theodore Roosevelt visited Ok­
lahoma on a hunt. He visited 
Quanah Parker's home and dur­
ing the conversation the Indian 
chief told the president he had 
adopted the white man's ways 
and even adopted his religion. 
Mr. Rosevelt told Quanah there 
was one thing he should do 
since adopting the white man's 
religion and that was to live 
with one wife instead of four. 
He added he should select one 
to live with but provide for the 
other three.

Quanah came bark quicker 
than a flash, saying he would 
do It if the president would se­
lect the one for him to live 
with and then go tell the other 
three.

Quanah continued to live 
with his four wives.

I BOOKER, o k  LA- (WNS).
“Uncle Martin” as he is affec-1 the infamous "Berbary Coast
tionately called by the people of | San Francisco, 
this town, k one of the few re- He worked for a blacksmith at 
maining old “ freighters of the Dodge City from 1883-84. “ I never 
Southwest. saw too much of what went on m

His fuil name is Martin M adi-! town,” Unc Martin said. “The 
son. He’s 86 years old, hard-of- blacksmith I worked for advised 
hearing and nearly blind. He gets roe to stay out of the town after I 
around on a cane, and hjs speech finished work for the day, and I 
is tinged with the accent of his followed his advice pretty well, 
old country, Denmark. He has a There were lots of killings and 
great sense of humor and usually [gambling^ and everything else." 
manages to pop up with a wise- T~ ,ooc 1 
crack on almost any subject of 
discussion

In 1885 he came to Texas. For 
a short, time he made wooden- 
beam plows, then decided there

Over a period of many years, i a *Mture in hauling
he has grown somewhat cynical fr®‘8ht. He formed a partnership 
about some things said by his“ they Mr'
torians. In fact, he strongly dis- ° m ^1°*
agrees with a lot of things written ™here JL0rtnH!10tt»»Vu8 l?"
by the recorders of history. And ca*cd' to D ^ffe City. Mobeetie
he definitely has a right to dis- served as headquarters,
agree, for he’s lived the things the Intelligent Mules 
historians have written about. “ I hffd a pair of trained mules"
Knew Bat Masterson tbe freighter recalled “And I

bought me two good horses, really 
For instance, Uncle Martin was fine animals. Later, someone stole 

asked: j my horses. I ’d rather had a bullet
“ Didn’t you know Bnt^Matersbn, ( through me than lost those horses.

Anyway, I had to use my mules 
then for pulling the wagon. They 
were two smart mules. I could say: 
‘John boy, go get your collar. 
We’ve got to get to work.’ He’d 
bring the collar to me, but I’d 
have to take it out of his teeth.

city marshal of Dodge City?
“ Yep, I knew Bat Masterson,” 

he replied. “One of the sorriest 
critters that ever lived.”

“ But didn’t he clean all the gun 
slingers out of Dodge City?” he
was further prompted J ’At least He wag pretty stubborn and liked 
that s what history saul, Uncle to keep R iirkfis mouth when he
Martin.

To which Uncle Martin retorted: 
“He didn’t clean nothing out. His

got it.’
On his freighting trips, Une 

Martin had to forge the Canadian
tory said he did, but he didn’t.” I River, Wolf and Bear Creeks and 
So it’s history's word against that the Cimmaron River. “ They were
of Uncle Martin  ̂ and Unc Martin all tough to cross,” he said. “But

the Canadian was worst of all.” 
Unc Martin made many a trip to

lived at Dodge City when Bat did 
Was Cabin Boy

■ ■ ■ ■ ■ ■  . Adobe Walls. “ It was just a ranch
Uncle Martin was bom in Vest- then,” he mused.

ments of tourists are to be given ] tion they put out in July, 1943. 
credit, is resulting in an extraor- The edition was made up of 64
dinary “city of courtesy.”

Ward County Men 
Start Irrigation 
Of Farm Lands

MONAHANS, TEX. (W NS).— 
Although oil and ranching are the 
major industries of Ward County,

ervig, Denmark on September 6,1 
1860. The outstanding thing he Galhercd 
remembers about his childhood is 
that all Danish children had to 
work. “The little boys and girls

He stayed in the freight busi­
ness for about two and a half 
years. After that, he became a 

. , 1 “bone man,” then a popular occu-
f t .  ^  pation. “ I gathered cattle, buffalolike they get here,” he said. "Over 
there they work as soon as they
can move ”

When he was a youngster about i eon „ . „  # - .  _  
7 years old, Uncle Martin took tol*2? “ * n

and occasionally human bones 
alorfg the trails,” he said, “hauled 
them to Dodge City, where I got

Unc Martin also lived for some
............. ................  ....... ........ -  . I1*  ”  »<-. T P! ? T I|°'Ii Vm iu ™ . in Beaver City, Okla., then

I pages. It was novel in the fact it about 60,000 acres of farm land ,0\s "  l*> a‘ a 1 »  y. H “ Timm
All of which adds up to the contained not one inch of display

American and Leader policies in a 
nub hell — “ worthwhile journal
ism.”

Schneider came pretty close to 
being a doctor instead of a news- e r s® d. 
paperman. While attending the 
University of Texas from 1930-34, 
he took a pre-medical course. But

advertising. It contained 500 local
pictures.

Our advertisers sponsored the 
and pictures,”

are under irrigation, in the Rpd estimates he crossed the Atlantic 
Bluff Irrigation District, in the dboUt 11 t,mes'

No man's land” “ There were 
tough ones living in Beaver,” he 
said. “ But there were also manyly is t . iv t ,  in uifr j A  r iih in  h nv t r iv o lp r l  n il su ,u * D U ‘  m c ie  w c ic  at.™ m aiij

south and west portion of the ‘ good, upright and honest people.over the world. One voyage m par- ’ __ _ ° ____D„„., _voyage in par 
ticular still stands out in Unclecounty.

Red Bluff Dam on the Pecos 1Mo ,*!..*« _ _ _ _ _  Tl . . <A11. 
River supplies the water, which ‘ lin tho A n J : *  L  Z
provides alfalfa, cotton,

FIND U8E FOR CLAY
_______ __ __________ _______ _____  DALHART, T E X .  (WNS.)—
he changed his mind about enter- Quality clay deposits near Texline,

ney up the Amazon River on a 
grain boat engaged in hauling lumber

sorghums and feed. At Barstow, fr. _  everyone in Booker as
28 mi,vs wvs, of her,. 20.000 ^  t r ^ w .r ^ H in T 'y o T n g  te'S « »  * ' « *  » « ' " »

are Unde.r a?d from India. “Some of them had
ing the business of pills and puny Channlng and at other points in z000 8<̂ LeS ( ’ randfal,s* been hired and I think a few had 
people, and entered the field of arf a indicate that small rcr- rones south of here, according to heen swiped from their country,
puns and presses. .imic plants are a good possibi.ity J. N. McKean, manager o the be recalled. “We would talk to onpuns and presses 
Htarts Newspaper

He went “ to press" with a mim­
eographed newspaper at Chilli- 
cot he in 1934 and published it for 
four years. Then, he stored away 
his stencils and went to Quanah. 
where he began working for the 
late Harry Koch of the Quanah 
Tribune-Chief.

Thereafter, Schneider withdrew 
from the newspaper business for 
six months, which he spent as a 
defense plant worker.

“Then the newspaper stuff got 
in my blood again,” he said, “ and 
I worked with different papers 
over this area, promoting special 
Victory editions.”

Schneider said that’s what 
brought him to Tucumcari and he 
had an opportunity to stay, and 
did.

Mrs. Suthers had been operating 
the American, since the death of 
her husband, “Hi" Suthers, in 1938. 
Haa Shop Troubles

Left alone with the paper, she 
had quite a job on her hands. To 
make things worse, print shop la­
bor, like all other labor, became a 
luxury, to be had only if one was 
fortunate enough to encounter 
some unemployed printer.

for future development here. Chamber of Commerce 
Texas University has established a 
department of ceramic engineer­
ing and a research laboratory in
ceramics, and is attempting to in- fight ticket said we 
terest Texas groups in developing more fighting for two bucks than 
the industry. It could include the we ever saw in our lives. Shucks, i J^Vight race ” 
manufacture of bricks, tile, glass, J guess he forgets how much

marriage license costs.

He was married in Beaver at 
the age of 55. His wife was 45. 
Neither had been married before. 

His wife became known to
‘Aunt 
years

ago.
Unc Martin has lived in Lip­

scomb County since the late ’80’s. 
During that time, he has been out 
of the county for only four years. 
“ I wish I was out of it now,” said 
Unc Martin. “ I don’t like it. Lived

one
another, each in our own lan- 

_ ”  “  , , . Iguage. We couldn’t understand a
° n* of our Promotion friends word Df what the other was say-  -----r----lrmw » Rut

the other day, tiring to sell us a ing but We got ak)ng just being bere too dadgummed long. But
............ see youngsters. We called them the i be,* f *^th|S witn a_̂ grm.̂

‘Brown people.’ They are a fine, [

and art pottery.

Higgins Citizens Pass 
Honors of City Offices

HIGGINS, TEX. (WNS).—Pol Un­
ties la taboo with the people of i°bp 1,1 town- the kind of jobs the 
Higgins.

That is, politics in the sense that

smoke coming up from a weiner,
_________________________#________ Uncle Martin related. “ Right then
average young man of the times ?rub any ki.nd looked pretty 
worked at.

Buys “Hot Dog
Uncle Martin’s first encounter

He now lives in the home of 
Mrs. John Settles of Booker. A 
painting of his home in Denmark 
hangs on his bedroom wall. Seated 
in a chair with his hands folded

with the legendary American “ hot in his laP* Unc Marbn ,en3°y2 
dog” proved disasterous for a New reminiscing on the early days oi 
York Coney Island vender. It hap- the Southwest 
pened in New York City just after
young Martin’, .hip had put into (parking Meter Gets

I passed this place and saw Sooils of the Purse
3ke rominff nn frnm o ____  ___ABILENE, TEX. (WNS). — A 

parking meter is good for most
I «o5 to n ^ V rw eX ^ id e lin d  anythin? Vntil

most people usually think of the on several occasions, for Will at 
word-arguing and deceiving and this time was working on the W.

He met Comedian Will Rogers aske<? the man there—‘How much• . ___? fnr II.  a . l j    , •  .

promising 
elected.

this and that to get

Agent Is Staging 
Fight to Control 
Johnson Grass

LA MESA, TEX. (WNS.)—T. A.
Barfield, county agent of Dawson 
County, Texas, in cooperation with j name on the ballot, and that’s why

Take the office of mayor for in­
stance. It s more of a routine honor 
passed around among the town’s 
citizens than an office to fight 
and raise a big hullabaloo over. 
That’s the way Mayor Roy J. 
Landers, who has held that office 
since 1934, explained it when ask­
ed how he got into politics.

“ I never got into politics’," he 
said. “There’s no real ’politics’ in 
Higgins. The city offices are Just 
kind of passed around to us all, 
and the man who is elected to an 
office is naturally expected to do 
his best with it. I got into our 
‘politics’ when someone put my

porter starts investigating. Police- 
1 *  Viv’ to'ld^me- ."di'me^and C. U  Harkey. collector from
I bought it But when I got out-;lhe parking bandit., now know' * 
side again, the weiner didn’t smell meter to be a safe deposit for a 
too delicately and it tasted worse |car keF* ln «ddiUon to slugs and 
It was hard as a bo^rd I went Recently, a Reporter-News em-

the Texas A&M Extension Service 
is staging a major fight against 
Johnson grass in the area- His bat­
tle plans exceed that of any other 
Texas county for the year 1946.

The commissioner's court has 
purchased 10 tons of Johnson 
grass poison and, in using a co­
operative plan of purchase, saves 
local farmers up to one-half the 
usual cost of the poison.

Farmers not only use the poison 
on farm acreage but are spreading 
It in surrounding ditches and out- 
land to stamp out this thief of 
crops.

I ’m mayor.
Bom in Hood County on Oct. 26, 

1889, Landers came to Lipscomb 
County eight years later with his 
father and mother. The family 
traveled in a covered wagon. It 
took them 11 days to make the 
375-mile trip. They didn't find 
much upon their arrival; just a 
group of shacks and saloons sport­
ing a population of about 150 
people.

Roy worked on his dad’s ranch 
until he grew into young man­
hood. Then he held a number of

_______  prove practical. She had to call
Uncle Martin settled down in Harkey to open the meter and r£- 

the United States when he was trieve the key before she could 
about 17 years old—by accident, move her car and go home.
While in New York, he received a I Harkey didn’t say if she was 
letter from his mother back in parked over-time.
Denmark, instructing him to got - —
see her brother who lived in New 
York. Now neither young Martin 
nor his mother had any idea then

P. Ewing ranch located 16 miles 
southeast of town.

Since 1910. Landers has been an . . . , ----- - ----- -
agent for the Sinclair Refining back }n> P)®*tered the thing in the1 — j,. ~ r.” ', . . nirkle
Co. He now is wholesale distribu- Proprietor s face and headed for ploy**. attembt,nL l?  rar kev 
tor for that company, and runs a door- Th* man’s wife caught !n a  meter, dropped her car key 
Sinclair station about a block south her apron on something trying to , ,nto the *1®t , ,n̂ eatb “  d 
of the city hall. catch me.”

The mayor was married to Edna 
Maltsberger on April 24, 1912.
Speaking of Mrs. Landers, he said:
" I ’ll tell you something interest­
ing about my wife. She was bom 
and reared in this county and has 
never lived outside the county in 
her life.”

As for his "political" life, Land­
ers became a member of the Hig­
gins city council in April, 1921.
He served in this capacity for sev­
eral years. When Mayor T H.
Black resigned, Landers complet­
ed his term of office. He was elect­
ed mayor thereafter.

Hunting is his hobby. "But there 
isn’ t the good hunting in these 
parts that there used to be,” he 
said.

The mayor’s son, Roy Landers,
Jr., works for his dad in the Sin­
clair station. The youth does a lot 
of reading, especially stories on 
the earlier days of the South­
west. He’s proud of the fact that 
his dad came to Higgins in a cov­
ered wagon.

Shamrock Man
iikii n ia m u u ier  naa  any iaea men |
of the vastness of the state. It took' DeVClODS INCW 
the young seaman much longer to I__ _ _ *K in  im / .ln  « « J  ___ i .  ___  *1 1® _Building Tile

SHAMROCK, TEX. (WNS).— 
. . .  , . ... .. „  , ,— - - — ,W. E. Carver, Shamrock, has per-

sailed, taking with it all his clothes fected a new building tile which

visit his uncle and return to New 
York City than he thought it 
would. Upon his return, he whs 
dismayed to find his boat had

and possessions.
Moves West

The young seaman stayed for 
awhile in New York. But the 
United States was continually 
moving Westward, and colorful 
tales of tiie Western frontiers were 
brought back to the East by 
travelers. Unc Martin, intrigued 
bF the stories of this territory, 
headed west to old Dodge City, 
Kansas, then almost as ruthless as

will be manufactured from a na­
tive rock formation, gypsum.

Carver, who has lived in Sham­
rock for two decades, envisions a 
new manufacturing industry for 
the Southwest when he is able to

gel into production. Walls or roofs 
uilt of the new tile will insulate 

the house against changes of 
weather jk> frequent. In the Plains 
country ana will also make the 
structure lire-proof.
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Artesian Springs 

Are Now Under 

Development
BALMORHEA, TEX. (WNS).— 

A special arrangement with the 
Kingston Ranch owners has en­
abled the Rureau of Reclamation 
to harness the waters of the Phan­
tom Lake Springs, which have 
their source on the Kingston prop­
erty.

Thi\* special contract provides 
that the owners wi!1 take water 
for their own needs, the flow of 
the springs being then diverted to 
community irrigation. This con­
struction will be part of a program 
to add irrigation for 3,260 acres, 
bringing the total irrigation of this 
locality to over 10.000 acres. Water 
acquired from this source will, 
during an irrigation season, ap­
proximate the net yield from the 
Lower Paries Reservoir when filled 
to capacity.

The fertile, green community of 
Balmorhea and Reeves County is 
made possible by three artesian 
springs, San Solomon (or Bal­
morhea >, Griffin, and Phantom 
Lake. Four seep springs in the 
area are Saragosa, East and West 
Sandia, and Toyah Creek.

Balmorhea, the largest and most 
important spring, was at one time 
called San Solomon, but the Park 
Board preferred the name Bal­
morhea. Its development could be 
called the result of a lucky acci­
dent.
Sudden Increase

When work was begun on the 
project in 1933 by the CCC, the 
boys were at work making a 
swimming pool around the Bal­
morhea Spring. They were putting 
a collar around the spring, to pre­
vent its interference with their 
work. Digging down a few feet to 
get a foundation, they suddenly 
found the water gushing forth. The 
spring had suddenly increased its 
flow with the new surface opening. 
Just below the lake a 1,000-acre 
natural basin was found, which 
formed an ideal storage lake.

The spring is now the center of 
a huge bathing pool, said to be one 
of the country’s largest, the crown­
ing feature of the beautiful Bal­
morhea State Park. It is 215 feet 
in diameter and has two rectangu­
lar wings, each 215 feet long and 
70 feet wide. The spring sends out 
26,000,000 gallons of water a day. 
Old timers like to recall that this 
entire section, now green and pro­
ductive, was known 75 years ago 
as Tola Pond and was worthless 
marsh land.

R. J. Walter has been appointed 
construction engineer on the Bal­
morhea Project in Reeves County, 
according to an announcement 
made by Wesley R. Nelson, Direc­
tor of the Regional Bureau of 
Reclamation.
Structures Added

Construction will consist of work 
on the Phantom Lake Canal and 
an Inlet Feeder Canal, according 
to Commissioner of Reclamation 
Michial W. Straus. The existing 
Madera Diversion Dam, the Main 
Canal and laterals are to be re­
habilitated, and new structures, 
consisting of a concrete canal 
heading, a m^tal flume, closed con­
duits. and turnouts and wasteways 

, will be added. Farm production 
* in Reeves County and the Madera 

Valley will be increased consider­
ably, and the added water during 
off seasons will irrigate valuable 
winter pasture for livestock, Straus 
stated.

Phantom Lake Canal will be 
4.25 miles long, and the Inlet 
Feeder canal 2.8 miles long. One 
of the two concrete-lined canals 
will extend from the spring to a 
point several hundred feet below 
the heading of the San Solomon 
Spring Canal, and the other from 
a point one and one-half miles be­
low the heading of the San Solo­
mon Spring Canal to the Lower 
Parks Reservoir.

Construction costs are estimated 
at $380,000. The district will repay 
$255,600 annually in 40 install­
ments, without interest. ^ 
Economical Program

The work on the proposed con­
struction program would not be 
wasted in the event of more com­
plete development at a later date, 
for all work to be done, as well 
as the water rights involved would 
be used in any future development 
of land and water resources in the 
Madera Valley. Too, the cost of 
all work at this time and the cost 
of water rights and rights-of-way 
will correspondingly reduce the 
cost of any future development.

The present annual assessment 
by the district for operation and 
maintenance is expected to be in­
creased about 16 cents an acre as 
soon as the proposed project is in 
operation.

It is estimated that when this 
area is fully developed K will be

Those aren’t horses on the bit-end of those bridles— they’re 
college educations. Miss Frances Sue Elliston, four and one-half 
years old. and her cousin. Pat Elliston. six. have formed a 
corporation to breed fine Shetland ponies to finance their collegi­
ate aspirations. A minor stockholder In the corporation is Byrle 
Elliston. the grandfather to the girt and an uncle to the boy.

* *  * * * *

Youthful Tards’ Form 
Education Corporation

HEREFORD, TEX. (WNS).—Perhaps the corporation boasting the 
youngest directors in the west, if not the entire United States has 
been formed here with an educa-4- 
tion the sole goal for profit.

Texan Prospects for 
Gold But Makes His 
Strike With Salmon

QUANAH, TEX. (WNS).—Lon-* --------------------------------

Miss Frances Sue Elliston, four 
and one-half years of age, and Pat 
Elliston, age six. have incorporated 
a Shetland Pony farm to breed 
and raise fine ponies. The third 
partner is Byrl Elliston, grand­
father of the young lady and uncle 
to the young man.

The youthful directors each 
has a fine pony. Recently the fe­
male executive suggested they had 
better plan for their future, “ if 
we ever want to amount to any­
thing.” Pat agreed.

Miss Elliston wishes to attend 
West Texas State College in Can­
yon; Pat prefers Texas Tech at 
Lubbock. She wants to major in 
home economics to lay a founda­
tion for becoming a good cook. 
“Grandpappy likes eggs and bacon 
fixed in a certain way and I'm

Snake Roundup 
Attracts Best 
Men in Nation

OKEENE, OKLA. (W NS).—One 
of the oddest annual rodeos in the 
Southwest is staged here each 
Spring. It is the Okeene Rattle­
snake Roundup which attracts con­
testants from all over the region, 
each endeavoring to catch rattlers 
alive and bring in the largest 
catch.

Sponsored by the Junior Cham­
ber of Commerce, cash prizes are 
offered the winners but it is no 
place for “ lily livers” or “ lace 
pants” lads. Hunters agree it is 
3  real “ he-man” affair.

Following the hunt the live rat­
tlers are brought here for measure­
ment and photographs.

Every conceivable type of trap 
and snake catcher is used by the 
adventurous hunters. Long poles 
with leather noose are the most 

1 popular, although old-timers claim 
: the tricky box attachment to a 
pole is quite capable of snagging 
any rattlesnake striking at the in- 

i trusion upon their nests.
Sponsors of the hunt usually 

! make investigation prior to each 
| roundup, locating the snakes at 
j some designated place in notorious 
Salt Creek Canyon, ill-famed nest­
ing grounds of man-killing rattlers 
or in the Gyp Hills which circle 
the great Okeene wheat valley 
about 20 miles west of this city.

Some equipment is furnished for 
the tenderfoot hunters; doctor* 
and first aid experts accompany 
each trek and experienced guides 
are with each group. Lunch is 
served during each expedition, if 
one feels inclined to eat.

Those wishing to attend next 
year’s safari are invited to notify 
the Jaycees. Many counties are al­
ready nominating their bravest 
and best snake killers for the next 
year’s jaunt.

Each hunter must bring his own 
“snake bite”  remedy, it is warned, 
as Oklahoma is still a dry terri­
tory.

The only reason some husbands 
speak sharp and to the point, is 
because that is the only way they 
can get a word in edgewise.

capable of producing annually 
more than a million pounds of cot­
ton, more than one and three- 
fourth million pounds of cotton 
seed, more than five-thousand tons 
of alfalfa, and a similar amount of 
grain hay, making a forty per 
cent increase over present produc­
tion.

going to take care of him,” she 
explains.

Pat intends to study agriculture 
and ranching. He has a good be­
ginning as his father, Nolie Ellis­
ton, is one of the leading Palamino 
raisers of West Texas.

Frances Sue is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. F. B. Elliston.

“ Dixie” and "N ig" are the names 
of the two Shetiands owned by 
Frances Sue and Pat respectively. 
Even the ponies seem to have ac­
quired the spirit of the new cor­
poration.

Byrle Elliston admits he is mere­
ly a minor stockholder in the busi­
ness. "A ll I ’m supposed to do is 
finance the venture and handle 
their profits through a bank un­
til they attain college age. I be­
lieve both of the youngsters are 
sincere and predict a healthy 
future for their business," he said.

Feeder Tests Show 
Profits for Farmers

TEXICO, N. M. (W NS).—First 
feeder test made in New Mexico 
showed remarkable pound gains 
for hogs in an experiment super­
vised by Tom Hudson, vocational 
agriculture instructor. Texico FFA 
boys made the tests in their feeder 
program, keeping records on cost 
per pound of gain with two sup­
plemented diets.

Records showed that four pigs, 
weighing 87 pounds, were fed one 
supplement for 100 days and 
weighed out at 255 pounds for a 
cost of 15 1-2 cents per pound of 
weight gained. Another group of 
four pigs, weighing 88 pounds, was 
fed another supplement the same 
length of time, and weighed out 
at 247 pounds—at a cost of 16 2-3 
cents per pound gained. The third 
lot of four, weighing 77 pounds, 
was fed nothing but straight grain 
and weighed only 127 pounds at 
the end of 100 days—at a cost of 
42 cents per pound of weight 
gained.

Much interest in the experiment 
is being shown in nearby towns, 
and a similar test is being made at 
Elida, according to Hudson.

Williams Company 
Starts Experimental 
Vegetable Farm

LOVINGTON, N. M. (WNS).— 
Three hundred twenty acres of 
land six miles from here have re­
cently been purchased by the Will­
iams Farms Co., of Oxnard, Cal., 
for an experimental vegetable 
farm.

According to the owners, P. W. 
Williams and L. B. Plumb, Jr., 
there is a period between early 
crops from the east and late Cali­
fornia and Arizona crops, when 
there is a shortage of fresh vege­
tables. They intend to remedy it 
from this region.

C lev»Lee, local manager, states 
this experiment will take approxi­
mately five years. Lee has pioneer­
ed several projects of this kind in 
California.

Plans are made to raise about 
100 acres of carrots, 50 acres of 
lettuce and 50 acres of tomatoes. 
Sixty to 70 acres of this amount 
will probably be planted this year.

The average American motorist, 
in peacetime, travels some 8,100 
miles per year in his car. Travel­
ing men average 18,800 miles per 
/ear.

nie Quanah Liston returned to his 
hometown recently to inspect the 
area for which he was named and 
to recall oil boom days which 
gained him a fortune that faded 
into a huge mid-western debt, and 
taught him there was nothing like 
good old soil for a profession.

Now a citrus farmer in the Rio 
Grande Valley of Texas, Liston 
was bom in Quanah almost 45 
years ago. He moved with his 
parents to Seattle, Wash., when 
nine years of age and before he 
attained the ripe old age of 15 
was in Alaska, driving a dog- 
sled team for a group of pros­
pectors.
Tells of Education

One of the gold-seekers in 
Alaska was a former school 
teacher from Iowa. Regardless of 
how cold the Alaskan nights or 
how hard the day’s trip might be, 
the teacher made Liston study 
math, writing, English and spell­
ing. He taught the lad so thor­
oughly Liston believes he has 
the equal of any high school edu­
cation.

The Texan made his strike near
Anchorage, not in gold but in a 
Salmon fishery business. It seems 
the owner of the canning plant 
hod a run-in with local officers 
and deemed it expedient to leave 
for Canada immediately. At least 
that was his story to Liston, and 
the boy purchased the entire busi­
ness for $2,500, paying $100 down. 
Three years later Liston sold his 
property to a company for $25,000.

Returning to Texas, Liston 
heard of the oil development near 
Vernon and Electra and plunged 
in. "It looked like everything I 
touched made money,” he said. “ I 
made a fortune, got married and 
intended to settle down for the 
rest of my life. But then hia luck 
started reversing.
Wife Takes Air

His wife “ ran off with a pipe 
salesman,” Jie laughed, “but she 
almost cleaned me out by taking 
my securities and selling out my 
Wichita Falls home and property 
while I was in Chicago on a busi­
ness trip. What she left me I in­
vested in Chicago stocks and went 
under with the ill-famed utilities 
crash.

“ My fortune then consisted of 
less than $5,000. My health was

not too good and doctors advised 
me to seek a lower climate. I hit 
out for Texas.”
Hears of Fortune

He spent $2,000 of his funds try­
ing to regain his health by taking 
mineral baths, found out he was 
more worried than physically ill 
and went to Brownville on a fish­
ing trip. While there he heard 
fabulous tales of the Valley; how 
fortunes were being made each 
season from small investments. He 
investigated.

Near Mission he found a small 
15-acre orchard deserted. The 
orange groves were growing up in 
weeds; the lemon trees and grape 
fruit bushes were almost dead 
from lack of water/ It took Liston 
a week to locate owner in 
Los Angeles. A $200 telephone bill 
over two days* period transferred 
the property to his name and his 
remaining money was spent.

A local hardware merchant 
trusted him with supplies with 
which to work his orchard and a 
lumber yard "trusted” him for 
repairs on the two-room house. 
He started "settling down” again. 
Fortune Regained

The rest of his story is history. 
He married a Texas girl who liked 
orchards. Today they have three 
children, own more than 1.000 
acres of the fertile Valley land, 
an 11-room home, and interest in 
two canneries. His fortune has 
been recouped.

He expressed hope of never 
owning any more land on which 
oil is discovered.

“ Your money comes too fast 
: and you spend it too foolishly," 
| he explains. “ I ’ll take mine >n 
good old soil, the way the good 
Lord intended it to be worked—* 
in person."

Sell Your Story
HERE'S HOW to make that 

extra spending money. Every 
community has a colorful char, 
acter suitable for a feature 
sthry. Get the picture, write 
the story and send to P. O. 
Box 2347, Amarillo. Texas. If 
acceptable, it will appear in 
this supplement under your 
name and you will receive 
regular correspondent rates for 
your effort.

W A N T E D
ADVERTISING SALESMEN

All unusual opportunity is offered men and women 
between the ages of 21 and 15 to represent us in “key” 
points throughout the Southwest, selling display adver­
tising in one of the greatest medium of combined 
weekly newspaper coverage in the United States. Men 
and women desiring a connection with a proven insti­
tution representing a combine of better weekly news­
papers, will have the opportunity of earning more than 
$150 per week, if they own a car, exercise ordinary 
ability and are not afraid of work.

Our plan is unique, entirely different; a medium 
which appeals to manufacturers, wholesalers, jobbers, 
schools, colleges, etc. Our openings, on an attractive 
commission basis, are in (lie following cities; San 
Angelo, Abilene, Sweetwater. Midland, Lubbock, Plain- 
view, Amarillo, Dulhart, Clovis, San Saba, Coleman, 
Stamford, Vernon, I)cl Hio, Quanah, Hreckenridgc, 
Wichita Falls, Tyler, Longview, Palestine, Waco, Hryan, 
El Paso, Brownsville, Port Arthur, C.recnvillc, Gaines­
ville, Corpus Christ, and Cordell and Guyman, Okla.

Out of the group employed in these cities, four will 
be selected after training, to fill positions as district 
managers for Houston, San Antonio, Fort Worth and 
Oklahoma City.

We prefer those with some newspaper experience 
but this is not essential. Do not apply unless you mean 
business. Mail references in first letter to Gerald V. 
Smith, Advertising Director, Texas Press Club Building, 
610 East Tenth Street, Dallas, Texas.

You may wire or telephone for appointments.

Telephones

I^akeside-3886 or Winfield-3125

. W E S T E R N  N E W S  W E E K
I l f  • B P 4 B A  « ■ »
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Hunting In Tri-State Area Promises Luck
License Sales Up; Bag 
Limits Assured Nimrods

ON THIS PAGE is a story frorr ♦ -------------------------------------------
KerrviJle, Texas, the * deer terri- j area e x c e p t  Kelly ^(uge open

w V ' t ^  rL ,  ' McCoy It troth *  T
b, prove if a man can shoot, he - 7- Sacramento^Otero Coun-
v.,11 get his deer this season. 300 permits for buck or doe

7He same hope holds true Seasmi: Nov. 10 to 21 inclusiive. 
throughout New Mexico and Okla- final date for applications, Oct 
h 28, 10 a. m. This area lies west of

NEW MEXICO DIGEST Shelton and O’Banion Ranches
and south of Mule Canyon.

The Sunshine State (New Mexi- w jj] be allowed to kill
eo) advises bear may be hunted rnore than deer in New Mexico 
frmn Sept. 15 unUl Nov. 5. No dogs during ^  104«  reason Do not ap- 
tnay be used in the Chama area ply jor a perwit on more than one
north from highway 84 until Nov. area 
22, when there, as elsewhere, they _  . ___

1. Upper Pecos Area: Seasonmay be hunted with or without _____ _____  ______
do/* uni,I Dec. 10 No hunting i* '■ .
permitted anywhere from Nov. 6 N°v- 3\ >nclusi\e. One
J mj * q * hundred twenty-five permits for
u> N O V . v. either a cow or a bull. Deer and

There was no open season ; turkey may not be hunted at this 
antelope this year m the State tim<
du# to drouth. , 2. West Vermejo Park Area: 75

Fishing remains good in New permits for either a cow or buU. 
Mexico. One angler took an 11- Season: Oct 29 to Nov. 5, inclu- 
pound brown trout near El Vado, give. On this area no game but
and three to four pound wall- elk may be taken. Residents will
eved pike* were caught at Conchas be given priority over non-resi- 
within the week.

There is no closed season on coy-
dent applicants.

Applications for elk permits
ctes, skunks, and mountain lions must be accompanied by $10 fee. 
and no license is required for Permittees must also have regular
taking these animals. Beaver may big game license
be taken only under special per­
mit.

There is no open season on blue
grouse, prairie chicken, sage chick­
en, choker partridges or pintail 
grouse, bobwhite quail and mearns 
quail in New Mexico.

Sealed or Gambel Quail may be 
shot between Nov. 26 and Dec. 15.

Note: No special application form 
is necessary: just submit your name 
and complete mailing address and 
specify area where you desire to 
hunt No fee other than hunting 
license is required for any of the 
deer permits.

OKLAHOMA DIGEST 
The Sooner State is good hunting 

grounds but rules and laws are dif-indusive, sunrise to sunset, bag 
limit 10 per day and 40 per sea- ferent. Herewith is a digest of 
son Don't get caught with more animals and birds which should be 
than 10 quail at one time. followed closely:

Pheasants. Nov. 23 noon to sun- There is no season on badgers, 
set Nov. 25. Limit two birds per Brant has special laws and sea- 
geason. Check local territory for ar* announced annually, with
r u l<.„ a daily bag limit of two and not

Dmk*. Gm ,  »nrt Nov.

,luvk* and 2 geese may be pos- annua„ y 0nly one dfter ^  ^  
... . . . N r  . killed and the season is also an-

Morgnnsers (fish ducks) *>d- nouncod annual^.
eral season: Nov. 23 to Jan. ft In- ) Dove seasons are also announced 
elusive. Limit 25 per day. No state annua||y wjth a daily bag limit of 
restrictions as to season or bag 10 and possession of 10.

I Eox may be chased the year 
Rads and Gallinules: Season — round but you had better not be 

F«-p 1 to Nov. 30. inclusive. Limit caught with one in possession. 
15 in the aggregate. Mink, muskrat, and opossum arc

Check State rules and rcgula- non-limited. Geese seasons are an- 
tions on birds nnd big game be- nounced annually with two to four 
fore hunting, wherever you go In daily hag limits.
New Mexico. There is no open season on pra-
Nrw Mrxleo Summary Irie chicken. Quail may be shot

No antelope season anywhere between Nov. 20 and Jan. 1 pro­
in the state. vided you hunt on Tuesdays.

Turkey season closed In Man- Thursdays, Saturdays, Christmas 
sano Mountains and Guadalupe and New Year’s Day. A calendar 
Mountains. , ° f  open days is supplied by the

Mt Taylor area north of Grants state, 
ch ed to hunting of any kind of Don't shoot 'coons although you 
gjune. may chase them the year around.

The regular big game season is There is no bag limit on skunks. 
November 10 to 21, inclusive. In Squirrel may be hunted from May 
addition, the following special 15 to Dec. 31, and w'oodcock may 
seasons have been established by be killed Dec. 1 to Dec. 15. Your 
the State Game Commission: limit of squirrel is 10 daily and

In all s|x*cial deer seasons listed, woodcock is 4 daily, 
w-ident applicants wil be given TEXAS DIGEST
pnority over non-residents. All | Ducks, gfene and brant;
applications should be dressed Nov 2 ^  Jan> 20 incluaive> with 
tc> State Game W arden, Santa Fe, exception of Lake Texhoma.
New Mexico. ____ ! OcL 13 to Dec. 31. Ducks, 10 in

1. \ ermejo I ark. 300 permits aggregate per day. two days’
Jg. “ T k a ^ ' r r  ^  possession, including not

Z 2* ’ incLu*lve’ ^‘vidcd into morc than one wo]ad duck Geese-
TT n0dS' W'!,h 4 blue and snow geese, plus two 

than 100 hunters permitted during o{ sorne other kind .including one

“ "J  PhSmcSftr ^ o u t  Rmrh Col brant’ * * *  d i T w o  days’ k ' »  »"2- Uhi mont Scout Ranch, Col- jpossession. Coot: 25. Only one
fax County: 200 permits for either d km in p,>sses?;ion 7
buck or doe. Season: Nov. 10-15,] Raj,5 aJld GaU,nules. ^  t , to 
inclusive, divided into two 3-day «  «n. . .
periods for 100 each period. One ™  o°Jv m i”  ”  ^\..... ..r _______________ :.o .-----d*F ° n,y °n<* day s kill in posscs-

Gatne Warden J. J. Dent of Kerr County and his pet deer, "Scrappy.”  The deer came closer to 
understanding spoken words than any animal in Dent’s experience with wild life. "Scrappy” began 
"banging around" when a baby fawn in 193< and died at the age of eight yearn.

* * *  * * *  * * *

Game Warden J. J. Dent Makes 
Good Hunting Possible in Texas

By W. V. McCOY
KERRVILLE, TEX. (WNS).—J. J. Dent has been game warden .. „  . . . , „  .... .

and wildlife worker in Kerr County for 31 years, and as proof of the *,on .. ,n different
way they feel about Dent and his work the people of the county have co.̂ ” t,es and covering over three 
presented him with a new car, complete with spare tire and insurance m,lllon acres. Most of these deer 
papers. Being a little shy about the thing, they made the car dealer d8'?6 •°m. ^  F®deral Aransas
present it to Dent, and the dealer minced no words, but almost u®e ,n Aransas County, 
threatened him with bodily harm if he didn’t take it. A  total of 1,446 antelope have

And there is a reason for the people to feci the way they do. been restored to 60 areas since
Kerr is said to be the most completely stocked with game of any
county in Texas. This is in a large 
measure the result of good methII.

hundred of above permits reserved 
for distribution by Scout Ranch to 
residents or non-residents. Final 
daW for receiving applications, 
Oct. 24. 10 a. m.

3. PhiJturn R e f u g e ,  Colfax 
County: 150 permits for buck or 
due. Reason: Nov. 16-21, Inclusive, 
divided into two 3-day periods for 
75 each period. Final date for re­
ceiving applications, Oct 24, 10 
a. m.

4. Ran Andres Mountains, Dona 
Ann County: 200 permits for buck 
or doe. Season: Dec. 1-4, inclu­
sive. Final date for receiving ap­
plications. Nov. 23, 10 a. m.

5. Snndin Refuge near Albu­
querque: 200 permits for either 
buck or doe. Reason: Dec. 1-4, in­
clusive. Final date for receiving 
applications, Nov. 26, 10 n .m.

6. Magdalena Mountain Area: 
East side of Magdalena Mountains 
and Kelly refuge, 400 permits for 
does only. Season: Dec. 4-8, inclu­
sive. Final date set for receiving 
applications, Nov. 26, 10 a. m. This

sion.
The season Is closed on wood­

cock.
Mourning doves and white- 

winged doves: 10 in the aggre­
gate. One day’s kill allowed in
possession. North Zone: Rept. 1 to 
Oct. 20; South Zone: Oct 20 to 
Dee. 1«

Chachalaca: Dec. 1 to Jan. 16; 5 
per day. Ten in possession.

No opcTi season on plovers, wild- 
sheep or elk.

Deer: (bucks with pronged 
horns) not more than two per sea­
son. East of Pecos River: Nov. 16 
to Dec. 31. West of Pecos: Nov. 19 
to to Nov. 24, inclusive. Fast ,, of 
Pecos, two bucks per season; west 
of Pecos one black-tail or mule 
deer per season,

Turkey gobblers: Ask your local 
game warden about counties al­
lowing kill this season. Bag limit: 
3 gobblers per season.

Peccary or javelina: Nov. 18 to

iiicuoui c  m t  ivau ii v i iiitu i- __ rjty
ods of exchange and transferring H w ®cres ar*d show you more *
game, and the development of the r „ Fou •roagined were in section 
various species of game animals as’ P® says- Dent’s method is Aron

1939-40. These areas are located in 
41 counties and represent over
1,500,000 gcres. All of the antelope 
were trapped in the Trans-Pecos

welL “ We try to get an equal dis-

IContinued on Pago 11| Mor bis work. "X can take you out a total oX 7,007 doer on 85 rcstora-

these were of the Rio Grande va­
riety except a few Eastern tur­
keys. They were taken to sites in 
South Texas, the Hill Country and 
the Panhandle.

The game department has a 
backlog of requests on hand for 
stocking game. The Game Com­
mission has adopted a policy of

occasionally. “ When you increase I a Wildlife Biologist in-
the sire and productivity of the ^  propOSPd
game, some good is being areom to determ,ne ,ts ««itability
phshed." Turkey in the Kerr area 
have increased an average of three

tribution on game,” he said. “ If 
a place is lacking in one type of 
animal we get an exchange with a 
place that is over-stocked. Some 
ranchers, for example, are willing 
tr> trade 10 does for one buck.”

Dent believes strongly in bring­ing animuU in fr, m *  mission nas adopted a pone
S L Z n .  u "H h .v in g  . Wildlife BiolSeist

. r , „  .... . to eo out lo n'r .nnV, nZ T “ Around 2,400 wild turkey have
by importing new blood. Still more l,£k it S t0 been plaw,d 011 73 acres in 65important has been the cooperation ' look it over carefully and
that Dent has received from the 
people. The game warden is one 
of the most liked men in Ken- 
County, because he feels that his 
duty is to render a service to the 
people rather thar\ to police them.
"A great number of violations oc­
cur because the people are not 
fully aware of the wildlife regula­
tions,”  Dent says. " I believe it is 
one of the warden’s chief duties 
to keep the people informed and 
conscious of all the regulations and 
the game conservation programs.”

Dent has a fondness for ani­
mals that makes his work a pleas­
ure. Deer that he has handled have 
been known to come up into the 
wind, sniff the air, and come up 
to let Dent feed them. "Turkey, 
deer and other wildlife will re­
member you if you treat them 
right,” he says. “ Rcrappy” is the 
biggest case in point.

“ Scrappy” was a deer that Dent 
tended and fed occasionally when 
the young fawn was growing up.
He became so friendly with Dent 
that he would come up any time 
to be fed, and finally came to al­
most understand Dent when he 
spoke. Dent could call his name 
and the deer would come, just 
like a pet. “ Rcrappy” became a 
mascot for the school football 
team, and Dent was at one time 
offered a Hollywood contract to 
work with the unusual deer he 
had trained. “ Scrappy” was a Ro­
man Nose Cacti Deer that Dent 
worked with for eight years.

J. J. Dent Is full of enthusiasm

plished.” Turkey in the Kerr area ' “ I L " 1*1? ’ P ll ^ rf nt Spe?'CS
have increased an average of three hav<: d," erent hab,tat requ.re- 
pounds in woiaht Doer a v o r Z  orients. Some game can cause much 
from 85 to 135 noimH. i?'*er,5e damage to crops, and this must be 
largest killed last lear w e i S  58 ôns(*dej;ed-.l It is also '"advisable 
pounds. He ha, In todJS l Fowle? J® stock wild turkey near a place 
Siki, Axis and European Red D<S Wbe^  ,lame tu^ eyf  arC, bu'n* 
here. African Antclone also Hr. ra,sa,,’ because the tame turkeys 
well in this section P do .will be attracted to the wild ones.

He debunks the theory that bob'* Ir\ Kerr Couniy  deer be
whites and blue quail won“t m?v < *OUnd on every 60 acres’ Turkpys 
because he has soon ihon, arp Plentiful, but it is harder to
in mixtures ™ ° ften kcep track of their numbers be-

Another theory thet has been ' C£l,Se ĥpy rni^rat DeCr haV!  
disproven is the belief that a dc£\ j f i? *11 *ncrcasc 23 years, and 
age could be told by the points *** tUrkey SUpp1y is bu,ld,n<Z up* 
In his experience w ith raising deer 
Dent has found deers of the same 
age to be entirely different in this 
Z«gard’. *°,™c having as many as 
10 points while others had very 
few. He says that the peculiar and 
odd antler formations on some 
deer are caused by worms getting 
in the antlers while they were in 
the “ velvet” stage.

In Texas as a whole, the Texas 
Game, Fish and Oyster Commis­
sion has trapped and transplanted

Odell Established 
On Pioneer Estate

Vernon, Tex.— (W NS)—Odell, 
a community in the northern part 
of Wilbarger County, was estab­
lished on the site of the T. H. Hol­
loway home. The Holloways came 
here in 1888. Many an early day 
fish fry took place on the bank* 
of Wanders Creek, so-called from 
its wandering course, which wound 
through the Holloway estate,
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■ M p g p H M p H p i  j'l l gwp ssgsp Yoakum County Agent 
Continues Fight for 
Good Crops and Cattle

PLAINS, TEX. (WNS).—Giving his county a well balanced agrf- 
cultural program, H. B. Horn was Yoakum’s first county agricultural 
agent, and has served tor 12 years, since 1934.

Treatment of grain sorghums and com against smut has been a 
major point in his program, and 90 per cent of the farmers have 
avoided this spot infestation by* ...... .
treatment, as well as enjoying a I stockmcn increased the active hfe
20 per cent increase in yield. Suoh 
following of scientific practice has 
added income for the rural popu­
lation in the county. Each year 
Horn has obtained samples of 
grain sorghums grown at the Lub­
bock Experiment Station for dis­
tribution to farmers for experi­
ment. Types which thrive in Yoa­
kum County are determined and 
planted through succeeding years.

During the past four years Yoa­
kum County has tested 98 per 
cent of Its cattle Tor Bangs Dis­
ease. When the tests were begun, 
20

CatUe graze on non-mowed area, left, and mowed paatare, right Such control of pasture brush more 
than doubles beef cattle production per acre In a better grade of feeder.

★  *  *

Ranchers Find Mowing Sagebrush 
Gets More Profits, Better Feed

WOODWARD, OKLA. (WNS).—The control of sagebrush and other* 
pasture vegetation by mowing, as developed by the U. S. Southern 
Great Plains Field Station at Woodward, is resulting In more beef 
cattle profits for ranchers of this area.

D. A. Savage, senior agronomist of the forage division, revealed 
recently that brush-mowing more than doubles beef production.

There are several reasons why. It increases the carrying capacity 
of a pasture 80.8 per cent, which amounts to an increase from 99
to 179 yearlings per section o f*  - ............... —
land. cess, Savage said the sagebrush

It increases the gain per head 
by a margin of 18.3 per cent. Sav­
age reported the average gain per 
head was 356.6 pounds on the 
mowed pasture as compared with 
306.6 on the non-mowcd area. 
Gains averaged 50.4 pounds per 
acre over a three-year period.
More Profit

In 1945 agricultural economic 
specialists surveyed the Experi­
ment Stations grazing result and 
found that mowed pastures made 
$2,165.10 more net returns per 
section than the non-mowed graz­
ing ground.

The station began work on brush 
control in 1937, conducting date- 
of-mowing tests on rangeland in 
the immediate area. Tests were 
made at semi-monthly intervals 
throughout the growing season; at 
monthly intervals during the win­
ter.

The purpose of these experi­
ments was to determine the time 
of year when mowing of brush 
would be most successful. Scien­
tists at the Experiment Station 
worked closely with the Depart­
ment of Agricultural Chemistry 
Research of Oklahoma A & M 
College, and after each mowing 
roots of the plants were subjected 
to an exacting chemical analyses 
to determine their reaction to the 
mowing operation.
Mow In Jane

Chemists discovered June was 
the best month for mowing be­
cause the roots contained less 
stored food this season than any 
other time of the year. However, 
they disclosed the mowing period 
could be extended into the latter 
part of May and early July with 
successful results.

Consistent experimenting re­
vealed mowing at other times of 
the year reduced the vigor of the 
brush but eliminated very few of 
the plants. Savage and his co­
workers concluded that June- 
mowing for two successive years 
obtained the best results, exter­
minating a greater amount of 
brush. Only one mowing killed 
out a comparatively small portion 
of the plants.
Defer Grazing

“ It is extremely Important to 
defer grazing—exclude livestock 
from a pasture—from June to 
September of the mowed years,” 
Savage said. “ This protection en­
ables the grass to recover, de­
velop a deeper and more exten­
sive root system, and compete to 
better advantage with the weak­
ened sagebrush.’*

Mowing proves a profitable op­
eration to pastureland. It makes 
surviving brush more tasty as 
winter browse, doubles the stand, 
vigor and production of grass, and 
reduces grazing pressure on in­
dividual grasses by making all 
plants in a pasture available to 
grazing. The feeder, grade of cat­
tle produced is greater as a re­
sult

should be left on higher dunes 
to help control soil-blowing. “ But 
it is extremely important to mow 
most of the brush in a pasture," 
the agronomist declared, “because 
livestock usually concentrate on 
mowed areas and are likely to 
graze them excessively If they do

not represent a considerable part 
of the entire pasture."

Almost any heavy-duty power 
takeoff mower, when properly 
equipped, can be used satisfac­
torily in mowing heavy brush, he 
explained. The operation requires 
a series of special attachments, all

of mother cows, the calf crop by 
85 to 90 per cent, and the weight 
of the calves at weaning time an 
average of 380 pounds up to 410 
pounds.

Irrigation is pioneering in Yoa­
kum County, with the first well 
drilled in 1940 on the A. J. Mabry 
farm used experimentally on a 
small scale. This year, E. P. Stan­
ford has drilled wells on his farm 
in the western part of the county 
for extensive irrigation. Water is 
encountered at 127 feet, but the 

, .. ...  ̂, water table rises to approximately
c« lt4 £  C!£U* T Te'  80 feet in the hole and some-

of which are manufactured by 
most machine companies.

Profits realized from mowing ing during the past 10 years at a

infected, but through disposal of 
infected animals the disease has 
been reduced to 2 per cent.

Horn has arranged for the treat­
ment of beef cattle for grubs and 
lice, and cattle growers have av­
eraged treating more than 4,000 
cattle each year. Since 1934, Yoa­
kum County has established out­
standing herds of registered Here- 
fords by following scientific prac­
tices in the control and treatment 
of parasites and disease.

Creeps, a disease caused by min­
eral deficiency, afflicted cattle in 
the county in 1934. Analysis of 
the soil showed that the deficiency 
was phosphorus and calcium, so 
cattle were fed these minerals in a 
50 per cent mixture of salt with 
bone-black, 1,600 tons of which 
were acquired through coop buy-

times as much as 69 feet. George 
Evans of Route 1, Plains, has also 
begun irrigation on his farm. His 
site requires an 80-foot hole, while 
water level will rise 40 feet after 
the water-bearing structure is 
tapped.

more than balance the costs of the saving of $25 a ton. Today, less 
operation. J than half a dozen cows in the

"We are also conducting simi- 1 county have the creeps, comparing 
lay work on the control of scrub to a 30 per cent infestation before ' toes are cultivated in the region, 
oak and skunk brush," Savage the use of minerals. By oliminat- where shallow water levels offer 
concluded. ! ing this disease, Yoakum County ! an abundant supply of irrigation.

Potato Crop Calls 
For Freezing Plant

HOUSE, N. M. (WNS). — Po­
tatoes, new commercial crop in 
this area, made possible a $1,000 
cold storage locker plant at House, 
a town of only 500 people. The new 
locker, opened last fall by the 
cooperative House Potato Grow­
ers Association, offers quick- 
freezing equipment of the most 
modern type.

C. A. Moirow is president of the
Cooperative.

Several hundred arres of White 
Rose, Cobbler and Triumph pota-

Building Stone 
Is Made From 
Volcanic Ash

HOBBS, N. M. (WNS).—A new 
industry for this area, and one 
which will be a boon to home and 
business building, is the manufac­
ture of building blocks from pum­
ice or volcanic foam found in this 
region.

Formerly all pumice was im­
ported from Italy, but with the 

, beginning of war, shipments were 
stopped. Deposits, discovered in 
New Mexico, were developed by 
the University of New Mexico, at 
Albuquerque, and the School of 
Mines, at Socorro, who made the 
first experiments and are still de- 

1 veinping this material.
Volcanic Deposits

Pumice is a volcanic deposit. In 
its mined state it looks and feels 
like popcorn. It has been used in 
the manufacture of toothpaste, 
rouge and powder, and as abra­
sive. but industry has found that 
building blocks made from pum­
ice have advantages over both tile 
and concrete.

Pumice blocks have high insu­
lating and accoustic value, and do 
not gather moisture as does con­
crete. These blocks are stronger 
than concrete, yet can be sawed 
like wood. Nails driven in pumice 
blocks hold as if driven in hard 
wood, and the blocks can be chan­
neled with a chisel for laying wire 
without cracking. They take paint 
easily and do not require the usual 
wire netting for applying plaster 
and stucco.
Called Azorir Stone

The Mineral Rocks Products Co., 
Inc., of Hobbs, is manufacturing 
and marketing these blocks under 
the copyrighted name of Azoric 
Stone. Present production of this 
company is 4,000 blocks n day, 
which will soon be stepped up to 
10,000 a day, according to Walter 
Famariss, Jr., president.

Blocks are made by mixing 
pumice with selected sand and 
specially prepared fine-ground ce­
ment, according to a patented for­
mula. This company also obtains 
pumice from the Cochiti pit, be­
tween Albuquerque and Santa Fe.

Eddy County Is Garden Spot of 
New Mexico; Income Is Derived 
From D ivers ified  Farm Crops

Part of Brash Left
In explaining the mowing pro­

OFFICIAL PAPERS CHOSEN
Official County papers for Woods 

County, Okla., for 1946-47 will be 
the Woods County Enterprise and 
the Freedom Call. Each paper will 
serve six month of the fiscal year, 
and in order to serve subscribers 
better, commissioners proceedings 
will be carried in both for the en­
tire y e a r .__

*  *  *  4

ARTESIA, N. M. (W NS).—The 
‘JUtopia of New Mexico,”  is a slo­
gan residents of Artesia and Eddy 
County might well adopt for in 
this thriving valley city is found 
mo6t everything anyone could de­
sire.

Produced and marketed in A r­
tesia anunally are 14,000 bales of 
cotton; 40 car loads of alfalfa hay;
800.000 pounds of alfalfa seed;
20.000 head of cattle; 40.000 lambs; 
1,000,000 pounds of wool and many 
other varieties of agricultural and 
livestock products.
Have 12 Plants

Twelve dehydration units In the 
Pecos Valley and five additional 
units in Artesia belong to the Ar­
tesia Alfalfa Growers Association 
which now boasts more than 200 
members. Alfalfa is chopped green 
and hauled to the dehydration 
plant where it is dehydrated into 
meal. Such product has three 
times as much carotinc or vita­
mins as does baled hay. Growers 
of livestock have found if 10 per 
cent dehydrated alfalfa meal is 
added to cotton seed meal, a much 
better feed results.

More than 6.000 barrels of crude 
oil are refined here daily. Deep 
tests now drilling in the county 
have good showings and all of the 
county land is under lease to prove 
its oil development future.
Modern City

Nine-tenths of the city streets 
are paved. The city has 8,000 pop­
ulation, modem hotels, tourist 
courts, homes, churches and other 
buildings. Twenty - eight n ew  
dwellings and business houses are 
now under construction, including 
a $50,000 Legion Hut.

There are eight Home Dem­
onstration Clubs within the county 
having a total of approximately 
200 members. There are nine 4-H 
Clubs with 225 members. ,

New Mexico’s Utopia City real­
izes it Is booming, but has so 
planned the expansion and de­
velopment program to where civic 
leaders believe the increase in 
population will be a permanent 
figure with future “conditions” be- 
.ng of stable variety and worthy 
*1 such expansion.

Typical of the 17 similar alfalfa dehydration plants found in and 
near Artesia. N. M.. Is this plant. All are owned by the 200 
members of the Artesia Alfalfa Grower's Assn. Cut green the 
alfalfa is hauled to these plants and dehydrated into meal.

Worthless Land 
Proves Valuable 
When Irrigated
Condensed from an article in the 

Matador Tribune
MATADOR, T E X .  (W N S ).— 

Worthless land, so-called, has been 
converted by I. F. Reed,’ northwest 
Motley County, into a fertile irri­
gated tract

When Reed purchased his farm 
he was advised not to try to grow 
anything on this tract, which had 
been “ turned-out’ of cultivation as 
worthless. Reed learned that a 
scspningly endless supply of water 
was available undir the flat, and, 
with limited funds, built a dirt 
tank and rigged a windmill to irri­
gate a small part of the land. Re­
sults justified his faith in the soil, 
and he later replaced the wind­
mill with a gasoline mote- and 
extended the size of the irrigated 
plot.

Tomatoes, green peppers, mel­
ons, cucumbers and other vege­
tables grew well, and last year he 
secured a federal irrigation loan 
of around $1,000, which enabled 
him to extend the irrigated land 
to 15 acres. On two of these acres 
he planted sweet potatoes, and has 
been able to harvest 300 bushels 
per acre.

Monahans Rancher 
Wins After Going 
Broke Second Time

MONAHANS, TEX. (W N S ).-  
Fern Tatom, rancher and real 
estate man, says he came to Mona­
hans when there wasn’t any moon 
and the sun was about the size of 
a watch. That was 41 years ago, 
and Tatom, who now owns .a
2,000 acre ranch southeast of here, 
has gone broke twice trying to op­
erate large ranches.

On the Tatom ranch, which ad­
joins Monahans, fine registered 
Herefords and registered Jerseys 
are raised, and Tatom plans to 
irrigate. He has 50 head of Here­
fords, and is selling out his Jer­
seys, although his entry won sec­
ond place in the Monahans Live­
stock Show. His Hereford entry 
w’on the blue ribbon. He also raises 
fine horses, and advocates running 
a small herd of topnotch cattle.

Tatom also adds, when speaking 
of his own bad luck with large 
ranches, that many have proved 
profitable in Ward County, citing 
Jim Thornton, who has made a 
great success ei  his 100-section 
ranch.

A terrace system, no matter hoyp 
well laid out and constructed must 
be maintained if it is to keep oa 
doing the Job it was intended fovw
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Santa Fe Pioneered Better Farms Program
H. M. Bainer Continues Pioneer 
Fight for Farmers in the West

(Editor’s Note: II. M. Bainer. 
general agricultural agent of the 
Santa Fe System, headquarters 
in Amarillo, may well look back 
today on a life of history-mak­
ing events in-so-far as the farm­
er of the southwest is concerned. 
Yet. desiiite a job well done, he 
is continuing with a career he 
loves, giving assistance to many 
thousands of farmers West of 
Chicago.)
AMARILLO, T E X ,  (W NS.)— 

Countless volumes and short 
stories have been written about 
the hardy pioneers who carved the 
way for a Greater Texas, but 
little has been devoted to the 
myriad activities to follow which 
advanced commercial progress so 
that it is in its present heulthy and 
lusty condition.

There are many factors which 
combined to advance the pioneer­
ing struggles of the first to settle 
in Texas. Primarily, cattle was the 
principal industry but other pur­
suits were required to round out 
the future of the Lone Star State.

Transportation was n e e d e d  
among the vital necessities. The 
railroad started to criss-cross the 
territory. But railroads require 
business if they are to survive. 
Railroads See Future

The vast stretches of Texas had 
to be |x>pulated. Again the rails 
aided. Railroad officials saw the 
need for taking advantage of a 
great agricultural area. Farmers 
were needed and were brought in­
to the country. Seed was needed 
and the railroads supplied this re­
quirement without cost to the 
grower.

Soon the State was on its way to

Hobbs Plans New  
Airport Building

HOBBS, N. M. (WNS).—The 
1946 city improvement program 
for this Eastern New Mexico town 
includes practically every phase 
of construction.

Contract will soon be let on a 
$39,000 administration building at 

... , .. the airport, which will make this
tivities under the expert guidance one of ^  finest in New Mexico 
of Bainer, is that of work among A 16. room> $i92.00O modem brick 
S fr/or i °hr8an,f  *°nS- F 6 ^ aS a i grade school will be under con-

th ^ T ,t  Rnvr°K»f?rndrhfH I «truction shortly, and plans t re in ganized the first Boys Kafir Club DroBress for a new hiirb school
at Sweetwater in 1912. Then fo l-|prog “  Ior a new mgn ?cn<K?' 
lowed similar organizations in 
Potter and Randall Counties.
Bainer and his assistants engaged

Pioneers In Boys Clubs
Another phase of his depart­

ment’s varied and extensive ac-

The city recently jyirchased the 
sewage and water plants from the 
Hobbs Water Co., for $376,000, and

in boys club work fully ten years I *ast sp*.'ng voters approved a sew- 
before the 4-H Clubs were started-( agf Q™ d water extcnslon »*sue of

County officials are working on 
plans for a new county hospital to 
cost approximately $500,000, and 
a $750,000 paving program for city 
streets is under way. City records

ere
With the establishment of 4-H 
Clubs and also Future Farmer of 
America groups, the interest of 
the Railway and its representa­
tives has kept pace. Today the 
Railway takes an active part in
progressing the activities of both,'5* ™  building permits to indi­
groups and for many years it has' viduals and business concerns have 
offered annual educational awards {???n issued at the rate of $100,- 
for those boys and girls who are 0 >0 per mon‘b. 
outstanding. In this connection . AICF .7 ^ . , .  n r N  n s i (  
letters of gratitude have been re- , , 8 GETS FI8H O K .
ceived from hundreds of boys and L Lake AJtu?’ n?a,\ A Lt.us’ ° k,a - °£,y aA teZ  Pound*. H Resembles 
girls whose interest was stimulated J has been declared suitable for use BOn Ami. It is believed to be a
and their education helped by the " *" ”  *“

Engineer Study 
Diatomite Deposits

CLAUDE, TEX. (WNS).—When 
the startling announcement was 
made from here two years ago 
about unlimited deposits of dia­
tomite found within the county, 
industrial seekers believed a new 
business would come to Claude.

Local boosters still believe this 
abrasive mineral will bring new 
payrolls to Armstrong County de­
spite no definite action having 
been obtained to date. Scores of 
industrial engineers and equally 
as many curious people have visit­
ed Claude to see the mineral which 
scientists believe was created mil­
lions of years ago when some gi­
gantic upheaval caused such de­
posits. Suggestions have been of­
fered for such enterprises as 
cleaning minerals, a silver polish 
factory, insulating materials and 
allied products. One man was in 
Claude recently to test the diato­
mite for cinder block buildings 
only to find it too light for such 
material.

A boulder of diatomite weighs

“Through the use of livery teams, 
motorcycles and later the first type 
of automobiles, we visited the 
forms of new settlers- Highways 
were beyond the fondest dreams. 
Hardship of travel over cowpaths 
and trails were commonplace. We 
advised the settlers on various 
farm problems and aided them in 
planting.
‘Cow, Sow and Hen’

railway.
The next time you see a 

load of wheat, or livestock, or 
other known products of Texas, 
give thought to a farming expert 
and his staff, employed by the 
Railway, pioneering in the in­
dustry which made that trainload 
and others possible.
Bainer Honored

The work. of General Agricul­
tural Agent Bainer and his staff

of boats. No private dock build- j volcanic substance and heretofore 
ing will be allowed, but boating I was found only along certain areas 

train 1 licenses for the remainder of the of the West Coast 
tram'  year will be issued at half price. In addition to the deposit near 

y r 1 this city, others have been found

.. „,ha* earned widespread recogni-
Products of the soil were not tion. Bainer, personally, has been 

prol> uP,?n w,blcl we awarded many honors. He is a 
a,dod j  * .  ieH*er- *1*° **m‘  charter member and holds an hon-

a position of agricultural industry j & k ^ m  ran i?  orary ,ife membership in the
which today is amazing the world. 25t.k’ "?h. rn nnVn’ mMr? American Society of Agricultural

The railroads continued to bring w !  nriainM^H «nH Ln* ,necrs: ** an honorary member
f t . ....... “  * " «  <S interest J S S f l C ' “ nV
wa'"contributwl by' Iht Santa'FV P!2 fr,a!!" !hat stot' v  w“  elected twice as

HOCKLEY COUNTY TAXES UP in Hartley County, Briscoe, Crosby 
Hockley County's taxable prop- and Dickens, 

erty evaluations for 1-046 have Samples of the Armstrong Coun- 
been estimated at around 33 and ty deposits are to be seen in the 
one-half million dollars. Last year’s Agricultural Agent’s office in the 
evaluations totalled $33,364,905. i Claude court house.

Mills County Editor 
Held Record When 18 
As Linotype Operator

served by the Santa Fe were pro
vidcd with suitable seed, free Of i VnVj1 V
cost, by the Railway. That wasn’t - and visited

ness by the back door when he was
six years old. Born in Mullin, Tex., 
10 miles from here, Jan. 10, 1894,

from Amarillo in member of the following organiza-
more than 90 im- tions: National Farm Chemurgic _ __ ................ ...... __ ___

all. These 3,000 farmers were l*>i;tant P0'^ 8 on Jhe Santa * e , Council; National Reclamation As-1 be attended Goldthwaite schools 
given seed for wheat, cotton, kafir, JIai*way ,n Iexas. In addition to sociation; American Railway Do- and fjnjshed high school in 1912. 
niilo and other crops, and the | I y|e^°Pmcnt Association; Awocla-1 fjis first job, at the age of six,
Santa Fe agricultural experts sup- "  ’ *
ervised 
of every
bushels of free seed, the best ob 
tamable, were given these farmers.

Associa-
........ .... ..........eluding dairy cows, beef stock, tion of Texas Agricultural W ork-[was heloing hig father Dr. E. M

the planting and growing s1cep' ^ogs and Poultry. These ers and the Texas farm Bureau yyiLson prjnt a religious paper on
V acre. Alt .grther 50,000 e* h,b,‘ ted at every P^mt and Federation. ! a hand press H ^  worked ^  the‘ in the 90 stop itinerary more than The ability of the father ap- ?, , °u i  l on. ,

37,000 farmers were attraqgcd to parently has been showered upon Kagle whi,e hl*^ school,
l. L .  ...... n„H RniV,nr and was employed there full-time

As it was in Texas it w i«  with the novel idea of a farm on wheels, his sons, Roy and Bob. Bob Bainer , t™ ^ . t  hV.. “ r «7r
nthPr Bainer pursued the idea of i. internationally known as an for two years thereafter.the railroad in the other great . V r Ikreaching into the farm areas with

b y , these valuable demonstrations. He 
” ‘ ’ was instigator of the first “Cow,

farmers ( ome In | an£j Hen" train which operat-
While these pioneering activities ed over Santa Fe Lines out of 

of the railway received their Amarillo in 1913. This train cover- 
greatest impetus through able ed an itinerary of 110 stops and 
agriculturists hired by the carrier, attracted more than 100,000 farm- 
officers of the company long be- ers and others, who were enthus- 
fore had seen the necessity of iastic over the demonstration, 
bringing hardy farmers into the I The department did not confine
territory. Farm groups from the | itself to demonstrations realizing
East and many boatloads from many farmers removed from rails 
Europe were induced to settle in | were unable to attend, but issued 
this and other fertile regions.

One of the outstanding agricul-

agricultural engineer, and was Holds Record 
associated with the University of, py tjme was jg years 0\(j 
California for sixteen years. He ( Wilson held the record of the fast_ 
first earned fume for leadership est Linotype operator in Texas, 
in the segmentation of the sugar He achieved this record while 
beet seed and also in the develop- working on the San Angelo, Tex., 
ment of special planting and har- standard> which he joined in 1914< 
vesting machinery for beets He After worki on Jthe standard 
also invented an internal combus- f . * . returned to
tion nut cracker for the removal GoWt^walS l ^ r e  h e t h e  
of whole moats from English wal- c!!i
nuts, l^ast year the University of f »US neS“’ w uch he
California loaned him to England, ,owed for two more years-

purpose of instructing I Wilson returned from the lure of
CHARLIE T. WILSON 

*  *  *for the purpose of instructing,
a number of valuable agricultural farmers overseas in sugar beet and chicken-feathers to his
bulletins. This practice has been production. (first love, working on the Gaines- I*00 was sold to Frank Smith and

turusts of the country and hailed followed by the railway down The second son, Bob, while not ville Register, Bryan Eagle, a Tilford Jones, nephew of Jesse
as such by many farm groups is through the years and today following the instructional course Pauls Valley, Okla., paper and the Jones.
General Agent M. If. Bainer of Bainer’s “ Agriculture in the Santa pursued by his father and brother.1 Texarkana Four-State Press, un- Worked on Standard
Amarillo. (»<*neral Agent Bainer | Fe Southwest.” recently published, is also making a name for himself til April, 1918, when he joined
is lrom a family of farmers and is much sought after by individ- and owns and operates a 10,000- 
his two sons arc outstanding in the| uals and groups in the many acre cattle ranch in Eastern Colo- 
same field. He was graduated from states served by the Railway. . I rado. 
the Kansas State Agricultural Col-| —------------------------------------------- ■ -
lege, after completing a special 
course in agriculture and animal 
husbandry. He taught three years 
of agricultural engineering in 
Iowa State College. He became 
head of the„Farm Machine De­
partment and Farm Manager of 
Colorado A Sc M College.
Becomes Amarillo Agent

Having established a widely 
recognized name in his chosen' 
field he was chosen to join the|

Winkler County Boasts 
A  Cemetery—No Dead, 
Fake Lake—No Water

agricultural staff of the Santa Fe I KERMIT, TEX. (WNS).—Oil and cattle have made Winkler
as Agricultural Agent at Amarillo. I ^ nn.ty T * ’ l ?  * [armVnot a"  acr* . of P^ghedtain u - Sound, not a bridge, not a culvert, not a drop of running water is

to be found there. One ditch was dug to drain salt water from an oil 
field, but is hidden under -------------------------------------------

Texas, in 1910. He was the first 
agent in that particular territory, 
but in those days was known as an 
agricultural demonstrator. Within 
a year the agricultural department 
of the railway at Amarillo had 
four assistants and the work grew 
apace with the assistants covering 
Texas, New Mexico, Western 
Oklahoma, Western Kansas and 
part of Colorado.

The department pioneered In 
this field work and wus establish­
ed five years before the creation 
of County Agricultural Agents. It 
wa$ ten to fifteen years before 
agriculture was taught in the high 
schools of the Southwest.

In explaining the efforts which 
were the forerunner of agricul­
tural activity on a widespread edu­
cational basis, B a i n e r  said:

highway.
Judge J. B. Salmon explains the 

one cemetery in the county by say­
ing that people thought tney ought 
to have one. so they killed a jack- 
rabbit, held a funeral, and thus 
satisfied tradition.

The famous White Sands give 
the illusion of water in a land of 
little rain. Located six miles north­
east of Kermlt, they cover five 
sections, and when the new An­
drews highway is completed will 
become a park area. Charlie 
Green, Chamber of Commerce 
manager, relates that, during the 
war, a Navy plane landed in the 
White Sands, thinking it was a 
lake. The sand is dry on top, but

moisture is found about a foot 
down.

Fourteen ranches operate in the 
county, which comprises 844 
square miles. Largest ranches are 
those of Waddell Brothers and 
Company, of 85 sections, and the 
Scarborough Estate Ranch, which 
is in three counties, Winkler and 
Andrews in Texas, and Lea Coun­
ty, N. M. Purebred Hereford cat­
tle are raised almost exclusively 
in the county.

Kermlt, despite lack of natural 
water resources, is an oasis, with 
the courthouse lawn beautifully 
landscaped and much green vege­
tation, maintained by aprinkler 
irrigation.

the Army. I Th® Wilsons then returned to
Servinp «■ » n San Angelo, where he again

throughout tne war hi h2l ! worked on the Standard. He wasthroughout tne^waj-. he bel^ng^ working on this paper when the
H ’ thr.A,?1̂ uni! ion1.Tra‘n second World War broke out, just 

of the 36th Division a7d>n* »n as he had been when the first
Brest, Franf®. l®1®- After one started. Another coincidence
a month behind the lines, his out- in his Ufe is the fact in 1941<

t0- “ \e . j Sept. 2, he returned to Goldthwaite and 
H,e hij discharge in . reboUght the Eagle, from Thomp­

son’s widow, exactly 23 years to 
the day after the original pur­
chase.

Mrs. Wilson has continued to 
work in her husband’s chosen 
field, and is now business and ad­
vertising manager of the Eagle.

the spring of 1919,
Returns to Paper

Back to the newspaper busi­
ness. Wilson first worked for five 
months on the Cleburne Review, 
then joined his father and his 
brother, Ernest E. Wilson, in buy- _
ing the Eagle from R. M. Thomp- j The plant has been modernized 
son April 1 1920 under their ownership and now

Next big event was his marriage ope^es two Linotype machine*, 
to Katherine Hendry April 26, J Help* Community
1921. She soon entered the news 
paper business with him. The 
young couple worked on the Eagle 
until 1926, when they moved to 
San Angelo. Dr. Wilson and Ern­
est continued with the Eagle un­
til 1929, when they sold it back to 
Thompson.

In San Angelo, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wilson operated a job printing 
shop and published the weekly 
San Angelo News, which later 
became News Photo. In 19SS, they 
sold the shop and moved to Cor­
pus Christi to enter the new field 
of radio. Wilson, his father and 
his brother started radio station 
KG FI there (now KRIS), end op­
erated It until 1WT, when the sta-tioo it to anyone.

Reserved, quiet and unassum­
ing, Wilson seldom talks about 
himself, but other local citizens 
will attest to his pubhe-spirited- 
ness. Brian Smith, chairman of the 
Mills County Red Cross Chapter, 
says that Wilson has not only 
sponsored but has promoted and 
backed to the fullest extent every 
worthwhile program for the town 
and community.

His wife adds to this tribute by 
telling of his experiences in the 
printing trade. She remembers the 
time when he produced an abso­
lutely perfect page for the Sen An­
gelo Standard, quite a record for 
any printer, and failed to men-

p a o c  n

Skyward
Curbstone Cattle Commissioners 
Of Canadian Do Thriving Trade 
By Check, Cash, or Credit

■ H i

CANADIAN, TEXAS. (W NS)—♦  
New York may have its Wall 
Street, London its Bond Street and 
Chicago its Exchange Building, 
but the code of the West has al­
ways proclaimed a man’s word as 
good as his bond. Here it is even 
better than a bond—or often his 
check as more curbstone cattle 
commissioners operate here than 
any other cowtown in the nation.

Approximately $2,000,000 chang­
es hands on sidewalks and in 
coffee shops in Canadian each 
year

another load of cattle to pay com­
missions and freight expense.”
They added it often took all the

“ ttle ‘° *et Wells to Add to
Carlsbad Digging

is. in e oonn oi ai- | _

".SSL “  lx)w Water Supply
»rofits are second-

home. But no cowman _____
quit his business. The bond of af­
fection between 
Stetsoned men
unbelievable. Profits . - -
ary to their love for the business.! C A R L S B A D ,  N E W  M E X .

Carl Studer, who operates a (W NS).—Irrigation in the Carls- 
groccry and bakery in addition to bad area dates back to 1600, the 

shops in uannaian eacn ranching interests, buys many beginning of the Spanish settlc- 
Cattleman buy, sell and head of cattle annually. He often ment Successful large scale irri-
i— 4-L* oina Kncinocc r\f « « (»1« 10A d<»ve »r» od - ttni inn hi ImPtl ifl OtHM'flt 1C »n siflCPtrade in the major business of 

Hemphill County, oil - boom 
rumors notwithstanding- It is not 
unusual to find cattlemen in local 
cafes and hotel lobby debating 
prices and conditions of steers, 
calves, bulls and other livestock. 
Many $25,000 deals are made over 
a cup of coffee where only an oraj 
agreement binds the contract. One 
such trade was made here recently 
when a young man agreed to pur­
chase a herd of yearlings for $25,- 
000. “ It’s a deal,” said the other, 
“ provided you pay for the coffee." 
Buy Without Money

Time and place of delivery was 
agreed. As the man started to 
leave the one buying the cattle 
asked, “ Do you want me to give 
you a check now?”

“ Why,”  asked the other, “ H isn’t 
any good is it?”

The buyer admitted it wasn’t 
until " I  go to see Mr. Wilbur.”

They agreed to meet at the First 
National Bank the following day 
to make settlement after delivery 
of the cattle.

Such trades are the rule rather 
than exceptions, H. S. Wilbur, 
president of the bank and also 
head of the Southwest Loan Co., of 
Canadian, agreed. The latter or- 

* ganization was set up to handle 
loans too high for regular bank 
channels. To prove his statement 
he recalled a loan totaling $107,- 
000, representing cattle purchases 
over a period of weeks. The buyer, 
an Amarillo man, used bank bill 
of sale drafts for money. He was 
here the next few days to execute 
a note and mortgage for the use of 
the loan company’s money. The 
banker agreed the loan “ very 
good” with collateral worth an 
easy $145,000.
Noted Ranchers

Well known ranchers of the 
county who admit they have trad­
ed on credit for a lifetime and ex­
pect to continue such practice in­
clude Fred Hobart, J. C- Studer, 
the I V Ranch, Bud Brainard, 
Frank Shaller, Ellis Locke, J. W. 
Sanders, Leland Caldwell, A. W. 
Adair, Henry Jahnel, L. M. Storm, 
M. H. Smith, D. V. Hardin, E. A. 
Meek, Lacey Tandy, J. B. Hender­
son, Grover Wilmeth, Ray Morey, 
M. H. Smith, Pat Huff, Steve Huff, 
Vernon Close, Tom Riley, Ramp 
Ranch, Jess Yoakley, Otto Yoak- 
ley, Jack Lawrence, Oscar Forgey,

numi C9I CHlUr UIIIIUUIIJ. •• ' —.........— - O ' --- ,----- .
contracts for cattle 120 days in ad- gation has been in operation since 
vance- “ I have only been asked for 1905. Dozens of different develop- 
a deposit once in 15 years of buy- ments have been made throughout 

»» he laughed, “ and that man the years to augment scarce waterW U g llC U ,  u u t i  M in t  >hmu m u  j t r a i a  a u g n i v u *  x .  ________

didn’t live in the county. He was • supplies, but farmers are now 
from up Perryton way, in wheat!working on wells to supplement 
country,” he apologized. the supply when the Pecos River

Dots Are the Best source is insufficient, and a good
These men may be worth for- showing has been made in devel- 

tunes on paper but often do not opment of underground water, 
have $10 in cash. Their boots and Harold W. Mutch, a Bureau of 
hats are the best on the market; Reclamation engineer, has been 
their shirts and pants probably compiling a report a study which 
didn’t cost $5. It is hard to find will indicate future lines of de- 
a cowboy or cattleman who doesn’t velopment on the Carlsbad Proj- 
boast a fresh haircut or the ect. Mr. Mutrh has been resident 
aroma of tonic. i  construction engineer on the Carls-

Hemphill is a cattle county, had Projects. “ During the past two 
Practically every pick-up boasts years we have had extremely dry 
high side-boards with which to seasons,” Mr. Mutch stated, “And 
haul cattle. And, every big truck it has become necessary to develop 
bears cattle of some description \ supplemental water. We are inves- 
down Canadian streets and county tigating in detail all the problems 
highways. of the Carlsbad water supply, and

The county is 30 miles square, from this study will be developed a 
Of its total acreage some 38,917 new program, possibly relying 
are in wheat, 30,000 in row crops more heavily on underground 
and 4,500 in cotton. More than water sources. We believe that a
508.000 acres are devoted exclu- close correlation between precini- 
sively to ranching. Approximately. tation, surface mn-off and the
30.000 cattle are grazed. I underground water supply will

Contrary to popular belief that furnish needed additional water
Hempmill County has m orej^ttle for the Carlsbad Project.”
per size than any county in Texas, 
it does not. But all agree there are 
more fine Hereford cattle here 
than in any other county in the 
state, and perhaps more Hereford 
steers than in any other county.

There are no goats or sheep in 
the county. It is strictly a cow­
man’s paradise.
Feed Is Short

There is not sufficient feed rais

C. A. Brown was caught In the act of harvesting his crop off 
The large crop is the result of Irrigation.

* * * *  *

Texline Farmers Find 
A  Little Water Helps

There i, nol ^tficlenl feed rai^  p o ^ M . to the extend of harming I ^̂ TOW Bl^^Cf PotatOCS 
ed within its boundaries to feed anothcr area also needing water. TEXLINE, TEX. (WNS).—An irrigation project of great magnl-
the county cattle. __ j We need a close, unified control of , tude is getting under way in this area, with prospects of 30.000 ac res.......................—j— i— — .arKâ x g v . m . Present irrigated acreage is 7,500,

Control Needed
M,£he variance of the water on 

this project has not been altogeth­
er the result of dry weather or 
natural causes,” Mr. Mutch said. 
“Upstream developments have j 
also played their part. Develop- 1  
ments on any stream need to be 
controlled so that over-develop­
ment in any one area will not be 
possible to the extend of harming

the county cattle.
Ranchers are running as many 

as 60 head of cattle to the section 
and many grazed cattle on wheat 
lands this season.

There are only approximately 
4,200 people in Hemphill County, 
according to the last census, with 
half of these living in Canadian 
city limits. Citizens are not jeal­
ous of other industrial sites. They * * --

our western streams,” he declared.
“ Farmers of this area have al­

ways been very cooperative,”  Mr. 
Mutch continual. “ Practically all 
of the original 40-year debt for 
construction has been paid off— 
more than 99 per cent of the 
$1,144,282. Payments are begin­
ning this year on the Alamogordo

of other industrial sites. Dam, constructed in 1936-37, and
content to raise better cattle wi|j ^  repaid by

___________n f  t k *  m w  7. .  .  ____

testify why cattle raising is the 
major industry of this sector.

Many eastern buyers from Iowa. 
,_v Illinois, Nebraska, Kansas and
CnaroA Mn( k J '1 c u ih v * i other states buy cattle here from
Tom Con“ t « r ,  Sam Ixoai, Thom.™ •'(Sd’ ourWoT markU” " '

' Tht Southwest Loen Compeny "ftj*o?°o
uieS^ , S 1 o n Udol1^a ,To°*uIis And- *• UnM< ou* o l 100 the- 
odd a™ tout business the benk S T S A

ana in Canadian.

are content 10 raih«- (.win De rep.-im oy all of the project
than any other section of the cow /lands -n 40 annua, insta„ mPn(s 
country. . „ .  The operation and maintenance

Herds rang.ng frem lM  to 4 . ^  charRe jg $? 60 ^  acrp year]y for
a minimum of three acre-feet of 
water. Construction costs on the 
Dam are estimated at $2 50 per 
acre per year.”
An Early Project

add the total business 
other commission buyers, 
eastern representatives operating 
with sidewalk connections and one 
can see a $2,000,000 annual esti­
mate is conservative of Canadian 
transactions.

‘Thi* will always be a borrow­
ing country,”  Wilbur declares

Hunting Promises
Ing ~'country,^ Wilbur declares ! (Continued from Page 8) 
“ Cattlemen use bank bill of sale Dec- 31. Two per season. West of 
drafts like script. They usually I Pecos, no open season, 
purchase yearlings or calves, plan- Squirrels: October, November
— — -riniorinB and summer ing and December. General law: 10 in90 in
|/uivuaov j ---------- m ___
ning on wintering and summering 
them on the excellent grass range 
in Hemphill County. The next fall 
shipment is usually two year olds 
and yearlings.”
Curbstone Market

Curbstone cattle commissioners

auu  s ^ v x v * > — ----------
any one day. no more than 20 in 
possession. Check with your local 
game warden.

There are scores of special game 
and fish laws in Texas. Be safe 
and sure by writing for the 1945-

Curbstone cattle commissioners *»*■« --------
of Canadian receive much chid- *6 Digest, Game, Fish and Oyster 
ing from the fun-loving stockmen. I Laws, State of Texas, Walton 
But they also receive praise for Building, Austin, in care of the 
their huge annual business. j Game, Fish and O^Sler Comm is-

Thomas Jones, Malouf Abrams, sion. 
and Bruct Waterfield are a trioj In the meantime, good hunting 
of commissioners. They are known and fishing. Let this corner know 
as “The JAW Outfit.” They head-1 of your luck. Send pictures, if 
quarter in the Killamey Cafe, • possible, and complete stories will 
owned by Abrams. Cowboys ad- | be carried throughout the hunting 
mit they don’t know whether, season.
JAW stands for the first initial• in n  Bumua sw* — :----- : . .
letter of each name in the trio A  rainfall of one inch over onein ter o i eacn nanny *•• --------- - _

. jaT ‘ ” C 411 ^  fe 0ver I o f 27,143 gallons of water, or 603
Th* JAW tmalTy ship, rtock to, barr*1* ot *  *aUon* * “ h- 

Chicago. They say the market] ’ f —— — — ——
often falters and "many times It Coal tar has served as a source 
looked like we would have to ahipj of about 500,000 derivatives.

During all the 40 years of de­
velopment the land has retained 
its fertility. Practically all of the 
original 25.000 acres is still good, 
productive soil.

The Carlsbad Project was one of 
the first developed after the Bu­
reau of Reclamation was estab­
lished. The Bureau was at first 
merely a branch of the United 
States Geological Survey. It then 
became known as the Reclamation 
Service, and from 1902 to 1910 
built several major projects in 
this area of the West.

Carlsbad was begun as a private 
development. Around 18,000 acres 
had been under cultivation for 
years when a 1904 flood washed 
out Avalon Dam. disrupting farm­
ing operations. In 1906 the Bureau 
of Reclamation took over the proj­
ect from the Pecos River Irriga­
tion Company. Avalon Dam was 
rebuilt, and canal systems were re­
habilitated and extended to serve 
20.000 acres. The Bureau began 
active operation of the Project in 
1911.

Flood waters of the Pecos River 
are stored in three reservoirs with 
a total capacity of 183.655 acre- 
feet of water. Alamogordo Dam 
and Reservoir are located 16 miles 
north of Fort Sumner, McMillan 
Dam and Reservoir are located 16 
miles northwest of Carlsbad, and 
the Avalon Reservoir is located 
six miles north of Carlsbad.

tude is gening unucr waj m ..—   ---- ,—
under irrigation when completed. Present irrigated acreage is 7,500, 
with more to be watered as soon as building materials and pumps 
are available. Wells average 125 feet in depth, and water is pumped 
from 60 to 80 feet. ¥  ■ ■ ■ ----  1 —

Alfala, corn and potatoes are 
principal crops at present, but 
farmers in this vicinity are plan­
ning diversified crops for the fu­
ture. One farmer cleared $140 per 
acre on alfalfa grown on irrigated 
land in 1945. The average com 
yield is 75 to 100 bushels an acre.

A paved highway through the 
valley is included in the program, 
with telephone and REA lines to 
service the ared. Prospects for an 
alfalfa dehydration plant are good.

C. A. Brown and Asa Wills, 
land owners of Texline, are two 
irrigation farmers enthusiastically 
predicting great things for the re­
gion under the irrigation program.
Brown formerly farmed irrigation 
project* in Utah and Colorado, 
while Wills was formerly a north 
plains wheat farmer.

Mitchell County 
Gets Fame From 
Dairy Farming

COLORADO C I T Y ,  T E X . 
(WNS.)— Dairy farming is fast be­
coming Mitchell County’s newest 
agricultural enterprise, with the 
completion of a cream station 
here, and purchased by more than 
20 farmers of dairy cattle.

Under plans of O. D. Dilling­
ham. president of the state dairy 
association, J. W. Webb and son, 
Homer L. Webb, have the first 
dairy in the county. Grade A milk 
will be produced on the Webb 
farm, which is 4>£ miles south of 
Westbrook. The Webbs have pur-

Cross Plains Man 
Recalls Planting 
Of First Com

CROSS PLAINS, TEX. (W NS), 
Back in 1885, with the sun in par­
tial eclipse, the first corn wal 
planted in Callahan County by 
the father of Samuel Foster 
Bond, who had arrived from Geor­
gia at the age of 11.

He has seen the town expand 
from a crossroads store, through 
its oil boom population of 5.000 
in 1925, to its present stable size 
of 1,500.

Bom in Mississippi in 1873, 
Bond still operates a grocery store 
here. He recalls a year-old post- 
office, a store, and crude gin here 
in 1884. The town was located 
on Comal County school land. 
When Texas joined the Union it 
retained its public land and these 
homesteads attracted the pioneer j 
to Cross Plains. Originally situ­
ated on roads leading to Camp 
Colorado, Bell Plains, Fort Worth, 
Fort Richardson, Fort Griffin, and 
to Camp Concho (now San An­
gelo), the crossroads on the plains 
was named Cross Plains.

When the “Katy” railroad ex­
tended its Line to pass nearby in 
1911, land owners pooled their 
land, laid out a new townsite, 
sold lots and moved the town to 
its present location, there to en­
joy a railroad boom.

Oil was discovered in 1920, and
chased about AO î ‘ s to red  J e r s e ; t h e  V e s ta l “was the first b ig  well 
It is hoped that eventually 50 . B 1922 when the
dairy farms will operate in the 
county-

The Banner Creamery of Ab 
ilene has just completed a rcceiv

brought in. By 1922 when the 
Burkett field came in, the popu-§ 
lation reached 3,500, but in 192*’ 
the real boom eame when oil was

. Many a casualty In .France 
came when a GI knew the right 
sentence to speak to a French gal 
but pronounced it wrong. '

ilene has just compieiea a rcceiv- ( ---------
mg station, where the milk is test- discovered inside the city limits 
ed and cooled before being sent (Depression then took its toll of 
to the creamery. Previously milk population and houses, followedbaitrf! avnUn.
had been shipped to Big Spring 
for testing. Across from the cream­
ery. a d;iiry barn provides facilities 
for the buying and soiling of regis­
tered dairy cattle.

by the war which halted expan­
sion. Now in 1946 new houses and 
business buildings are being built 
and the town continues to show a 

lsteady growth.
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Southwest Thanksgiving M enu Ready
Turkey Ranch in Oklahoma Was 
Started By Accident, But Has 
Proved To Be Worth Thousands

CORDELL, OKLA, (WNS.) -  
Jiggs “ Bringing Up Turkey’ 
Botchlet started the biggest turkej 
business in Oklahoma by accident

The big “accident,” that since 
has netted him thousands of dol­
lars, began back in 1934. He was 
then operating a small creamery 
station.

One day a farmer offered to sell 
five turkey hens and a tom to
Botch let. They were scrawney 
specimens, but Jiggs figured he 
could sell them at his station. So 
he bought the birds, which were 
thin-breasted, n a t i v e  Bronze 
turkeys.
Couldn't Sell Turkeys

It wasn’t long before Jiggs 
found he couldn’t get rid of his 
newly-purchased merchandise. He 
was mentally kicking himself in 
tin- pants for buying the turkeys 
when a young farmboy named 
Charlie Malone suggested he take 
Jiggs* turkeys out to his farm, 
raise them, and if and when he 
sold them, split half and half with

“ I had to do something,” Jiggs 
recalled with a grin. “ I had 10 
cents a pound in those darn things 
and I didn't want to lose out com­
pletely.”

He agreed to Charlie’s idea and 
BOW the largest gobbler 

farm in this state got its start. 
The* five hens and one tom soon 
expanded into a small flock.
Starts New Breed

In 1938 Jiggs had another idea. 
At this time all turkeys of this 
area were of poor quality. A seven 
months old tom, for instance, 
wouldn't weigh over 15 pounds as 
a rule.

“The farmers around here 
weren't raising anything except 
the thin-breasted Bronze,’’ Jiggs 
said. “They were 'grasshopper' 
turkeys—all frame.”  ,

So Jiggs went over to Childress,

Five turkey hens and a tom was the start that Jiggs Rotchlet 
had when he first entered the gobbler raising business. Above is 
part of the result of his hard work.

Recalls Life as 
Former Cowboy

SILVERTON, TEX. (WNS). — 
“Jake,” as he is known to most
people in Briscoe County, or Sher­
iff N. R. Honea, if you want to 
get formal, used to be a cow- 
puncher. Years of association with 
men of the range taught him a 
lot about the human race which 
came in mighty handy when he 
started to deal with people in his 
capacity as lawman.

Sheriff Honea is a tall fellow 
with a good-natured face that has 
been exposed to quite a bit of 
weather during his 56 years. He 
wears glasses, talks slowly and 
rolls his own smokes. His brown 
hair is beginning to gray a little.' 
His manner inspires confidence.

He has a deep and sincere re­
spect for his fellow humans. “ I ’ve 
always found that kindness pays 
off,” he said. “ We can do more 
good keeping people out of trouble 
than going around looking at the 
trouble side of everything.”*  *  | *  ★  ★  .-..vv, w .

of the ROP keep minute statistics center of the turkey farm. Jiggs
on each breeder hen and tom. This says in the fall “ it looks like mil- L» " r-*bidln* Peop,e 
observation i4 necessary to elim- lions instead of thousands when 
inate unfertile toms and non-lay- the turkeys cluster along the creek
ing hens.

A tom or hen may be a beauti
banks.”

A five-foot, poultry wire fence
K J u 'w h E S S  1 m  Si’n i 0 UK farm Jigw has no«7
1*1 Ln ‘«» 'V  iTo S J?>rneJ? d’ d‘ ?,gy; iost a turkeY to a coyote as far as looking gobbler may be excellent he knows. And the country here- 
for mating purposes. The keeping, at,«>ut is full of cojot—. 
of records on each bird u a boon J
to the business.”

The breeder hens are placed in 
their pens around Nov. 1 and kept

Starts New Plant
Walter R. Walker is the breeder 

farm attendant and George W. 
there for five or six months. They, Berry and his 15-year-old son,
usually start laying early in Jan­
uary.
Eggs Selected

Twice weekly a pickup is sent to

Ducas, keep up the rearing farm 
Recently Jiggs started construc­

tion of a $25,000 dressing plant to 
afford a local market for farmers

the breeder farm to collect the «,1 oj«K k! ty »•
eggs. Then eggs are selected for jio ffs.S ■ * 1 k ^9iT’
marketing and hatching. Jiggs will Tifrkpv pLwIltto n I"*,rHber of tbe 
not ship an egg that doesn’t weigh d? fuL^n d *? n,°W VICe
two and a half ounces-or more. | P dcnt ot tbat organization. 
They must be of good texture and Several weeks ago he attended 
uniform in size. He sells his eggs tbe Oklahoma State Poultry Show 
and turkey poults to buyers in 26 a* Oklahoma City. Fifteen states 
different states. wero represented with entries in

He has his own hatchery, equip- fbe sbow« which is open to anyone 
_  . . . ped with special turkey incubators, if1 United States. Jiggs placed
Tex., where one of the best turkey Thjs r â K>ut 75 ooo eggs will f,rst and fourth with his toms and 
farms in that state was in opera- be set which wlU hatch between took th' rd and with his hens. 

"  ffirm ,n ,h 50,000 and 60,000 poults. Of this L'—  -------- *~J *“  1--------tion The farm specialized in the
* r z t hrz st*  ,$r,m/eL  _# I number, Botchlet plans to keepWith the purpose in mind of hah 4.._i__  »___ _ _15,000 on the turkey farm; the 

balance will be sold out over the 
U. S.

“Several years ago I paid $25

building up the turkey stock of 
Ills area, Botchlet bought 50 hens 
and 10 toms for breeders.

His idea worked out beautifully.

Ever interested in increasing the 
quality of his stock, he purchased 
every first place turkey not al­
ready sold to someone else.

Jiggs has come a long way in 
the turkey field since his acci­
dental entry into it 12 years ago. 
He credits his success to “ lots of

from the‘ . pointed to his double-deck row of |uck and good friends-and the
b di * farmers *n hlt> ( hatching machineg b„ught an. broad-breasted Bronze.”

1 other and another as I needed i “

“ We have the best people ip 
the world around here,” he re­
marked, leaning forward and 
scratching the back of his head. 
“ We don’t have much trouble. We 
were blessed as far as juvenile 
delinquency is concerned.

Honea has been sheriff of Bris­
coe County for 17 years. His wife 
works with him in the sheriff and 
tax assessor’s office on the first 
floor of the courthouse.

“ I ’ve been sheriff for a long 
time, but then it took me a good 
spell to get the office,” he related. 
“ I ran three times before I was 
finally elected.”
Explains Law Interest

He was born in Cleveland, Ohio, 
and later moved to Nebraska. In 
1890, he came to Texas.

“ My daddy brought me down 
here,” the sheriff said. “ We came 
in ’90 and the county wasn't or­
ganized until 1892.”

Asked how he became inter­
ested in law enforcement, the 
sheriff explained: “ I lived a good 
deal of my life in territory where 
you couldn’t always reach an of­
ficer when you wanted one. We 
learned to keep law and order for 
ourselves. I ’ve handled a lot of 
men and I always knew pretty 
well how to handle the other fel­
low.”

Sheriff Honea also operates 
small farm near Quitaque.territory.

*  , ___ _ | umci auu uuuwier its I  neenra

h a l l  c o u n t y ’s  f l a t  t o p  h il l
had turkeys ran«in« from one-halt I °« bu.td-
to three-fourths to full-blooded *nga h“ “ be._ry‘

Raises ChickeMbroad-breasted Bronze.
Weighs 25 Pounds

Whereas th e  thin-breasted, 
seven-month-old tom of nearly a 
decade ago topped the scales at 15 
pounds, the new Bronze specimen 

^will average 25 or more.
And Jiggs isn't satisfied with 

the turkey quality of his trade 
area yet. He’s consistently pur­
chasing “new blood" from leading 
turkey farms all over the nation.

His turkey business consists of 
two separate farms. One is strict­
ly for breeding and the other for 
the scientific “bringing up" of the 
birds.
Science Pltys Part

Science plays a major role in 
Jiggs' business. From the time an 
egg goes into the incubator until 
the young poult grows into adult 
turkeyhood, it's detailed, condi­
tion-regulating process.

The 10-acre breeding farm is lo­
cated a half mile east of town. 
Here Jiggs keeps anywhere from 
1,000 to 2,300 breeders. About 300 
turkeys are kept in each of the 
four separate breeding pens. One 
tom is allotted to every 10 hens.

The toms are rotated from pen 
to p e n . Jiggs says this rotation is 
necessary since some hens will not 
mate with certain toms. The rota­
tion makes for a wider acquain­
tance.

He also has several chicken In-

WAS EARLY D AY LANDMARK
MEMPHIS, TEX. (W NS).—San*-------- ;------------------------------

cubators and does Quite a chicken. Francisco s famous Golden Gate 
business. I Bridge and Hall County's Flat

His “bringing up” farm, located ToP HU1 are alike ln one respect, 
seven and one-half miles north-1 They mean “home” to re­
west of town, covers 80 acres of turning residents of either locality, 
hilly, grassy land. Jiggs chose this ’Frisco’s puny, water-spanning 
rugged terrain because one of the structure has often gladdened the 
most important factors in turkey hearta of ocean-weary American 
farming is cleanliness, and a wash- travelers. And Flat Top Hill, often 
ing rain and baking sun quickly termed the “Gateway to Hall 
cleans up hilly ground. Every so County,” has many a time had a 
often, the breeder farm is also re- similar effect on residents of this 
lieved of all its turkey inhabitants county returning “ home” from an 
and allowed to recuperate in the easterly direction.
sun and wind.

A brooder house on the turkey 
rearing grounds has a capacity of

landmark
This historic landmark, located

4,200 residents. Measuring 100 by!*outheast of Memphis, has played 
30 feet, it consists of 14 individual an ‘mportant Part in the settling 
compartments and each compart-1thl* P°rt,on of the West. It was 
ment houses about 300 birds I the camP *»te ot transient Indian

erlng Flat Top Hill, they knew 
their journey was practically at an 
end, for they had been instructed 
to “ go to the flat top hill and turn 
west into the fertile valleys of Hall 
County

Salisbury, the first permanent 
settlement in the county, was 
founded in the shadow of the hill; 
the first land claim office stood 
near its foot.
Unmarked Graves

And, in unmarked graves In a 
forgotten cemetery, bones of early 
day settlers lie buried on the hill 
top.

When Hall County celebrated Its 
50th anniversary as a county in 
1940, gold medallions with the 
mesa engraved on them were sold

Large, kerosene-heated, thermo- before the white man came as souvenirs to raise money for a
st at-con trolled stoves in the center territory. It is believed the --------  --------- p
of each compartment regulate the
temperature.

The temperature is kept at 100 
degrees for the first five days after

infamous Apache war-chief, Ge- 
ronimo, and his warriors, made 
their camp in the shelter of the 
huge pile of rocks and red earth

the poults are placed in the brood- that stretches toward the Heavens 
er. Then it is lowered to 95, where a” d ends bluntly as if sliced by a
is remains until the youqg turkeys 
are two weeks old.

gigantic knife.
In the years to follow, the In- 

Temperatnre Lowered dians were driven back and the
When the “youngsters” reach b'® ranches began to take up the 

the age of two weeks, the tempera- Panhandle. Wagon-freighters from 
ture is lowered to 80, then to 75 Vern°n, Wichita Falls and Fort 
when they are four weeks old. The' Worth used the mesa as a land-One group of toms is intermixed “ T *  arT IT  , .u mark toVoid* the r trail,

w „h  .he hens r..r three weehs.
moving each week from pen to 
pen. This group is then herded 
into a “ rest camp,” a pen “ for 
men only,” and given a week’s 
rest period. Meanwhile another 
bunch of toms is put in with the 
hens. When their three weeks is 
up, they change places with the 

“ ooys who have had the seven days

in the brooder house.
Each compartment is outfitted 

with a wire-enclosed “sun-porch," 
where the poults may get their 
daily diet of sunshine and air.

At the age of eight weeks, the 
adolescent turkeys are turned into 
four “ hardening pens” or outside 
shelter houses to orientate them-vacation. Just before the birds are , 1 7- mu

released from the resting pen, each "nto *  ^

Hall County.
Settlers Move In

Later, when the large ranches 
were broken up and sold as farm 
lands, s e t t l e r s  seeking homes 
flocked to this area. When the 
prospective homesteaders saw tow-

tom is given a shot of codliver oil, 
Jiggs said.
Check Is Made

Botchlet is a charter member 
and director o f the Oklahoma 
Record of Performance. Members

their first outdoor 
range when 12 weeks old, and 
thereafter graduate from one 
range to another to make room for 
another “class” of birds following 
in their steps.

A  small creek runs through the

J. B. ELLISTON
REAL ESTATE

n«IISIii( til# Houlhwmt since ISM  

Hereford, Texas
“Town Without n Toothache1*

monument in tribute of early pio­
neers. The medallions were the 
size of fifty cent pieces.

Then there’s the soldier’s young 
bride who asked if she should buy 
the gravy from the grocer or the 
butcher.

Attention Manufacturers 
We Guarantee Distribution 

Regional and National
John B. Roberson 

& Company
Dallas I, Tons

We Hope to 
Soon Supply

IZUliThmEJH,u
d e a l e r s  w a n t e d

✓  Farwell, Texas

Andrews County 
Boasts 17 O il 
Fields at Work

ANDREWS, TEX. (WNS). — 
Named for the first soldier killed 
in the Texas revolution, Andrews 
County has a population of 4,000, 
according to a recent estimate, 
and this city is home to 3,000. A l­
though oil is the outstanding 
product, $150,000 is the annual 
value of the crops of grain sor­
ghum, cotton and corn raised here, 
with 46 farm owners in the coun­
ty and 60 share-croppers and ten­
ant farmers.

Ranching has long been the 
mainstay of the county, with 18,000 
beef cattle estimated recently as 
the range load, and an annual 
value of $650,000. Other livestock 
and their annual value are esti­
mated at 615 horses and mules 
$30,750; 400 hogs, $8,000; 1,600
sheep, $15,000; 8,000 poultry,
$6,000; and 300 dairy cattle 
$30,000. A  Livestock Protective 
Association, headed by Hence Bar- 

l row, serves Midland, Ector and 
1 Andrews Counties.
17 Oil Fields

Shafter Lake, northwest of here, 
produces red drilling mud, and 
salt, potash, and sodim com­
pounds are also available in the 
county. The lake was Gen. Shaft- 
er’s camping grounds, and its salt 
water is said to have killed a large 
number of negroes who mistook 
it for drinking water.

Extensive drilling for oil con­
tinues in the county, with 1,500 
producers now in operation. This 
year 300 wells were drilled, and 
there are 17 oil fields in the coun­
ty. It has been estimated that over 
six million barrels of oil are pro­
duced in the county each year.

A. L. Adkins, Jr., is county 
agent, also serving Ector and 
Crane Counties. Of the 962,560 
acres in the county, 20,000 are in 
cultivation on 106 farms, 939,360 
are in grass, and 3,200 are con­
sidered wasteland. Rural Electric 
fication Administration has 20 
miles of line, serving practically 
all the farms. Miss Billie B. Mox- 
ley is A AA  representative. One 
4-H Club is in operation with a 
membership of about 40.
Only One School

The Andrews First State Bank 
opened for business Nov. 12, 1945, 
and at close of business Dec. 31, 
1945, showed total assets of $297,- 
287, with $263,550 of this sum in 
individual deposits. Home own­
ers here are estimated at 1,200, 
with 250 telephones, 300 gas me­
ters. 700 light meters and 450 
water metero. Auto registrations 
total 1,596, and postal receipts for 
last year were $1,451.

One school, located here, serves 
the entire county, and has an at­
tendance of 1,000, and there are 
four churches in the city. Andrews 
is located on highways 51 and 87, 
and is served by six daily busses 
and a truck line. Its trade terri­
tory covers a 25-mile radius, with 
approximately 127 retail stores, 
four small hotels and one tourist 
court.

City programs Include plans for 
a sewage system, and the county 
hopes for an airport, completion 
of the highway to Kermit, pave­
ment of the highway to the Mar­
tin County line and to Lamesa. 
Though the shortage of housing is 
acute, 150 homes are in process of 
completion.
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amous Plains Museum Continues to Grow
’ Jurist . 

tliers Stones 
rom Over World
MIAMI, TEX. (W NS). — The 

oberts County courthouse not 
nly is the seat of justice in this 
unhandle city, but is headquar- 
rs for one of the nation’s great- 

museums, a collection created 
rom the hobby of County Judge 

A. Mead and his son, Kenneth. 
Thousands of tourists have in- 

irted the pre-historic displays 
udge Mead offers the public, 
pster in his guest book, and con- 

inue their journey to tell others of 
is “West Texas Smithsonian In- 

titution.”  And, their comparison 
s not far from wrong, as the 
mithsonian Institute has several 
mes sought specimens from this 

collection, especially where the 
hobbicst has duplicate items. In 
fact the institution has made of­
fers for his entire collection.
Halls Are Filled
I  Corridors of the court house, the 
basement, and Judge Mead’s of­
fice are filled with priceless speci­
mens dating back to pre-historic 
eras. The majority of the items 
have been uncovered in Roberts 
County, proving that once upon a 
time this area wan a gigantic 
ocean. A  huge sea turtle found 
near Miami by the jurist is one of 
the prize specimens as are many 
dinosaur bones and mastadon 
skeletons.

Scores of the visitors to this mu­
seum have proven their apprecia­
tion of the displays by sending 
prize collections to Judge Mead to 
add to the bountiful specimens. 
They arrive almost daily from all 
parts of the world. One recent 
visitor has sent specimens from 
South America, Australia and A f­
rica. Each item is catalogued, 
identified and bears the name and 
address of the donor. These items 
are considered priceless.

Like father—like son, is an ad­
age proving correct in this in­
stance. One son, Paul, a state

JUDGE J. A. MEAD 
*  *  *

the tame state; agate o4 Brazil; 
night blooming obsidian of Cali­
fornia; sardonyx of Brazil; fire 
cherry and waxy opals from Mexi­
co; moss agate from Oregon; chal­
cedony of California; camelian 
agate from Brazil; rutilated quartz 
from Brazil, petrified redwood, 
cedar, oak, and elm from Wash­
ington; yellow tempakya fern from 
Oregon; a camelian dinosaur bone 
from Utah.
Some Fran Africa

There are petrified wood gems 
from Arizona; malachite from A f­
rica; cyrsocolla from Arizona; 
jasper and yellow jasper from 
California; breccia ted jasper from 
California; lopis lasull from Chili; 
Mojave desert jasper; Inca Rose

KENNETH MEAD 
*  *  *

Rhodocrosite f r o m  Argentina; 
howlite of California; and tur­
quoise from Arizona, more than 80 
specimens in all, each reedy to 
mount.

Unquestionably Judge Mead’s 
collection is the oldest in Texas. 
It is known around the world and 
many foreign collectors carry on 
correspondence with the judge, ad­
mitting his authority on many 
items.

Judge Mead plans to will his 
museum to Kenneth in hopes he 
will carry on in presenting 
graphic story of the world’s prog­
ress, a story even a child may un­
derstand through visioning the 
data collected for an interesting 
display which is always free to the 
public.

Haskell County Is 
First in Terracing

Rural Mail Carrier 
Sets T im ing Record 
On Long Country Route

New Roads Form 
Junction for 
Eight Highways

SEMINOLE, TEX. (W N S ).—
This city will not only be the 
logical hub of the North Permian
Basin (oil pool) following the com- 1 in the Agricultural Conservation

ROCK SPRINGS, TEX. (WNS).¥- 
P. R. Wallace of Del Rio has been 
carrying mail and passengers to 
and from Rock Springs for four 
years.

But the rural mailman claims he 
himself isn’t a story.

“It’s my car that rates the 
write-up,” he said. “ I ’ve used it 
four years, making a round trip 
of about 250 miles three times a 
week, and never had to have a 
thing on it repaired until just 
recently, when I put in a new mo­
tor.”

“ It had 166,000 miles on It when 
I installed the new' motor,” he 
continued. "And you know ,100,000 
miles is suposed to be the life of 
most autos.”
Only One Flat Tire

Wallace also holds another rec­
ord.

He said during his four years 
of mail delivering, he has had only 
one flat tire, and “ that was a brand 
new tire at that”

Wallace leaves Del Rio early In 
the morning, drives to Sonora, 
then to Rock Springs and back to 
Del Rio in the evening. His sedan 
is equipped with a luggage plat­
form on top, and he has seldom 
made a trip without a passenger.

Wallace is engaged by Uncle 
Sam under a four-year-contract. 
Through bright sunshine or ice 
and snow, he makes the trip.

Most of the people atong his 
route know when to meet Wallace

were tied in the shade of a tree. 
Brings Groceries

“ Did you bring my groceries”  
the woman asked the rural mail 
carrier as he handed her a letter.

“ Yep, they’re in the trunk,” he 
replied, and got out to unload the 
merchandise.

Her husband took the sack of 
groceries. Then the couple climbed 
on their horses and headed back 
for the ranch house.

“ I don’t know what people who 
live way out from nowhere would 
do if this service were ever dis­
continued,” Wallace said as he 
drove on. “ It means a lot to them."

As for his bus service, Wallace 
has hauled as many as 11 passen­
gers at one time. That’s his rec­
ord. “ I told them if they could get 
in the car, they could go,’ ’he said. 
“ ’Course there was a bunch of 
little ones.”

Most of his passengers are Mexi­
cans. Wallace speaks enough of 
their language to carry on busi­
ness.

Wallace’s car. loaded down with 
luggage and people, is a familiar 
sight to the residents of this area.

Six Piffs Start New 
Program for Boys *

BEAVER, O K L A .  (W N S ).— 
Members of the Beaver Rotary 
Club have started a Pig Club far 
4-H Club boys. Six registered Du-

___ _ . . .  _  ___________ n  for their mail. “ I’m hardly ever roc Kilt8 were purchased and given
HASKELL TEX (W N S )_Thii over a minute or two off sched-' Boy Lou Howe and Wayne Al-

■ ’ -■ - ■ — -/............. i - ” — ;i— -  —•-* i l(»n of Beaver, Max Overton and
Dickie Yates of Elmwood. Ray-county ranks first in Texas in the ,d*>” mailman said. “That's

number of terraces built last year, why so many people meet me at 
more than 3,500,000 feet being their boxes.”
constructed. I Some of his “ customers” drive

According to Joe Harper, agent to their rural boxes, located at the

pletion of the proposed highway
game warden, contributes choice' ^  Martin County and the one to 
items regularly to his father’s col- Fullerton Field, now under way,
lection.
Builds Airplanes

But to son, Kenneth, who builds

but in reality is preparing for the 
influx of new citizens sure to 
make this a new, permanent ad-

airplanes at Burbank, Calif., it is dress. These new routes will also 
more than a hobby, it is his very form a junction for the eight high- 
life. As a youngster in Miami, ways now serving this city. 
Kenneth spent every favorable day 1 Preparing for the Insured tn- 
with his father exploring the area ] crease Seminole has spent $65,000 
of the Canadian River in search j increasing its water and sewer

Association office, 2,000,000 feet of 
terraces have been built already

« is year, and the county expects 
retain its “ first 

1946

edge of the road, in cars; others 
come on horseback.

A young rancher and his wife 
traveled the latter way, and were 

position for I waiting at the ranch gate when 
l Wallace drove up. Their horses

mond Monroe, Gruno, and Donnie 
Revert of Uie Forgan 4-H Club.

The pigs were bought near Cor­
dell. As is customary, the boys will 
give a gilt out of the first litter 
in order to perpetuate the club.

The average 1944 value for aR 
cattle in Texas was $50 per head.

for choice items and fossils. “Ken­
neth is the best hunter I ever 
knew,” Judge Mead declares.

When war came Kenneth stud­
ied aviation and became associated 
with Lockheed. But he didn’t give 
up his search for specimens. He 
merely increased his scope in 7.’ Vod 
which to search. Each day found p 
him on California deserts in search 
for lore. He found many prize

plants, and its $450,000 new high 
school building is now under con­
struction with a contract let for 
additional school buildings.

There are nine new business 
buildings now under construction 
with two large buildings recently

Eight additional blocks of homes
_____ _____ _ _____were recently voted within the

specimens but not in the quantity' California; lapis lazuli from Chili; 
desired. He launched a eorre- corporate dty limits. In the north- 
spondertee campaign with fellow west sector of Gaines County the 
collectors in Australia, South Higginbotham Cattle and Ranch 
America, Africa and other coun- Co. Is experimenting with irriga- 
tries, asking for native stones, tion facilities on a 700-acre block 
They started arriving in great of land. The company has drill'd 
numbers. [two wells at a depth of less than
Polishes His Gems

Kenneth takes the rough stones, ------ — — - - , inri . .
cuts them to finished size, polishes this area between 70 and 
each gem, facets them and, when with each well caPabb\ of
completed, they are ready to 1 gating one section of lanm_______
mount as a finished jewel. Jewel-

100 feet.
There te ample shallow water in

ers declare the stones “ perfect.” > 
The Miami museum today boasts ] 

a complete display of these gems. 
Some are of black palm root from 
California; banded balachite from 
Siberia; Lepidolite (petrified as­
bestos) from California; tiger eye 
from Africa; Palm trunk fibre 
from California; poppy jasper from
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People 

Do 

Get 

Wen

Not

JnHt

Temporary

Relief

THE ONLY CLINIC OP ITS KIND IN THE WORLD

A  PERSONAL MESSAGE TO  YOU
DID IT

ever occur to you that you are still suffering, because you think that your cose is incurable, and that 
nothing can be done about it?

IF YOU
could be entirely well, but refuse something that has helped so many people over the United Statei 
to health. Do you not think that possibly you are making the greatest mistake of your bfe?

CONSIDER
1st. Sixteen years of successful practice during which time—we are not bragging—but can actually 
show you by the people that we have treated more cases successfully than any one in the world.
2nd. There is only one cause for Asthma and only one cause for Hayfever. And when this one cause 
for each disorder is properly treated and corrected, it is impossible for you to suffer any longer.
3rd. The fact there is only one cause for each disorder—together—.with the fact these treatments 
have proven successful to hundreds of people over the United States, ranging in ages from 7 months 
to 82 years. People that had suffered for years and years. People that say had suffered all their 
lives. People, you might say, had one foot in the grave, that are well and enjoying life today. Do 
you not think that you have the same opportunity as they?
4th. Asthma and Hayfever are never inheritable. They are acquired disorders. Yes, you have 
acquired your suffering. Do you not think that you can acquire your health?
5th Where a perron has given their 100 per cent cooperation, I can truthfully say, these treatments 
have never failed. However, we do not take all cases. For instance, people that have other compli­
cations that would hinder their advancement.
6th. These treatments are so effective t

YOUR RELIEF SHOULD COME WITHIN FIVE DAY8 TIME 
THE FACTS

concerning your.case are very simple. Yes, as simple and as sure as 2 plus 2 equals 4. So simple, a 
small child can Understand the reason for your suffering.

WHY
BE SKEPTICAL—AND SUFFER THE CONSEQUENCES, You never had a better opportunity to 
get well—THAN NOW.

D R . G L E N  S I M M O N S
ASTHMA HAYFEVER CLINIC

13 YEARS IN  -------- ---------- ---------LITTLEFIELD , TEXAS



Pioneer Music Writer 
Scores Again With ‘Tejas*

■ f  OLETA PARK EE ----------------  - -  -  ..................... - ..............

ROT AN, TEX. June 4— (Spl.)— 
Mrs. Ella Hudson Day, nationally 
recognized composer, song writer, 
and penwoman, and godmother ot 
music culture in Rotan, the town 
that she and her husband, the late 
E. R. Day, helped to found in 
1907, recently published her soc- 
ond great Texas song, “Tejas,” 
meaning “ friendly state.’'.

Tejas, dedicated to “our fighting 
Texans and those who love us,” 
follows in the wake of her first 
great Texas song, Texas, Pride of 
the South, published in 1909, and 
in continuous use in Texas school­
rooms since that time- Both songs 
were written “ in an overflow of 
patriotism,” as Mrs. Day terms it, 
and bo‘.h bespeak her great love 
for her native state.

The new song eulogizes also the 
friendly tribes of Tejas Indians, 
found by early day white settlers, | 
and for whom the state was nam­
ed. The steady beat of Indian 
tom toms is carried in rhythmic 
overtones in the lively tempo of 
the new Texas song, which bids 
fair to become a second great state 
favorite. The composer received 
an invitation from the Austin 
Music Club recently to present her 
new song there, but was unable 
to respond.
49 Years of Composing

With characteristic wit, Mrs. 
Day declares— “I do not write 
music because I want to—I write 
it because I must get it out of my 
system, and that seems the only 
practical way to do it.” She has 
been “getting it out of her system" 
continuously for a period of forty 
years of composing and song writ­
ing, and she’s still bedeviled by her 

rsonal demon of creative genius, 
ost of her original compositions

MRS. ELLA HUDSON DAY 
*  *  *

accompany the band as featured 
contralto soloist. It was fitting 
that her greatest song should be 
introduced in the city so near the 
place of her birth, and Waco pro­
claimed her as a native daughter. 
Hailed Celebrity

In the years following the in­
itial introduction of her Texas 
song, which was promptly adopted 
by schools and colleges throughout 
the state, Mrs. Day, hailed every­
where as a celebrity, made request 
appearances as featured guest star 
at club gatherings in leading cities 
throughout the state; in innumer­
able schools and colleges; in orig­
inal program presentations over 
Fort Worth and Dallas radio sta- 

as
E . ■  _________ _____
deal with subjects of state and t‘on*> and as special guest and 
nation, with home and family and program artist in towns in her 
a sprinkling of humorous sketches, hometown area, 
making up the balance. An ac-| She was once featured in a 45 
complished pianist and soloist, she minute regional program of the
also plays string instruments

Her songs, sung in every state 
in the union, have traversed the

Dallas Branch League of Amer­
ican Penwomen. In February. 1924, 
hse represented the Rotan Cham-

of her greatest poem, When Every 
thing Is Green. Most of her poetry 
is written in humorous strain, on 
down-to-earth topics, and heavy 
with Irish brogue.

Other state and national literary 
organizations with which she was 
affiliated included: Texas Press 
Association; League of American 
Penwomen; Poetry Society of 
Texas; State Board of Federated 
Women’s Clubs; Daughters of Con­
federacy; District Chairman of In­
dian Welfare; Speech Arts Teach­
er’s Association of Texas; and the 
Dramatic Readers Club. Local ac­
tivities include: organizer and 
president of the Rotan Choral 
Club; Corresponding Secretary of 
the 21 Club; Chairman of Fisher 
County Music, for the Federated 
Clubs; and active leadership in 
musical programs in civic organi­
zations, churches and schools in 
the area. Because of family ill­
ness, she retired from club activity 
during the 30’s.

Lauded by the press and maga­
zine publications during the hey 
day of her musical and literary ac­
tivities, Mrs. Day received enough 
favorable publicity to be the envy 
of any modem day movie star.

The clippings of her early day 
conquests of the musical and 
literanr world would fill several 
fair sized scrap books — instead 
they are piled, helter skelter 
fashion, between the pages of one 
lone, dogeared book. “ I ’ve always 
been a bit on the lazy side,”  she 
declares, ruefully, “ I wrote my 
music—somebody else can paste 
my scrap book.”

Resources 
Near Brown wood 
Prove Valuable

BROWNWOOD, TEX. (WNS).— 
Mineral resources of Brown Coun­
ty have been tabulated, revealing 
vast, untouched resources in this 
area for potential industrial de­
velopment. Ceramics materials and 
chemical compounds are availa­
ble in different accessible vicini­
ties.

Resources having value In the 
building trades and household uses 
are listed as limestone, which is 
used in Portland cement, shale, 
which is also used in Portland 
cement, calcium carbonate depos­
its for quick-lime, limestone and 
soft dolomite for rock wool which 
is used in insulating material and 
for fireproofing, decorative stones 
in pure white, gray, brown, lemon, 
cocolate, maroon, blue and black, 
shale for tiles, silica for making 
glass, and flint and clays for pot­
tery.

Chemicals Include calcium car­
bonate in limestone, used for 
quicklime, calcium carbide, calci­
um cloride, and other calcium 
products including mixed stock 
feeds; strontium sulphate for use 
in pyrotechnics and in the manu­
facture of drilling mud; saline 
waters at the artesian wells, which 
can be used to manufacture chlor­
ine, which also contains potas­
sium cloride recoverable as a po­
tassium hydroxide, chlorine and 
hydrogen gas; sodium chloride for 
hydrogen and sodium compounds; 
and dolomite, which would make 
possible a number of calcium and 
magnesium products.

To keep beets from “bleeding,” 
cook them in their skins with part 
of the stems attached. Skins slip 
off easily when cooked.

Panhandle Man Is
Seeking New Club

PANHANDLE, TEX. (WNS) — 
Bill Slack, veteran oil field worlT

Fr̂ ^ 0,no C$rUnt?:- was born ** February 29. He has asked for
help in organizing a club of other 
February twenty-niners and ask*- 
“Just why-the-hell did they ? ver 
stick that extra day on my month 
every four years?”

Slack and other persons who 
have a birthday anniversary only 
each four years may blame or 
thank Julius Caesar.

Forty-six years before Christ. 
Caesars astronomers settled the 
solar year at 365 days and six 
hours. These hours at the end of 
each four years made a day, which 
was added to the fourth year.

In further reply to requests for 
information on this “ leap year” 
subject, the English r.ame for the 
366-day year is an allusion to a 
result of the addition of the extra 
day because after one of these 
years a date “ leaps over”  a day 
in the week.

On the other hand, look where 
it places women wanting to get 
married during such a year. The 
man, for once in each four years 
has the right of refusal.

PLAN REA LINES
DALHART, T E X . (WNS.)^t 

Mapping is in progress for oon- 
sfruction of REA electric lines in 
Dallam, Hartley, Moore and Sher­
man counties as a result of alloca­
tion of $250,000 to the Rita Blanca 
Electric Cooperative, Inc.

OUTSTANDING OFFICER
Vernon, Tex.— (W NS)—An out­

standing peace officer in Wilbar­
ger County was J. T. Williams, 
who served for many years as 
sheriff. Williams was never defeat­
ed for re-election, and at last re­
tired because of ill health.

• • • •••

ocean, and have been heard in , ber of Commerce and Fisher: 
most of the countries in Europe. County at the initial session of the j 
During the first World War, her Texas Centennial, held in Austin.' 
patriotic songs were on the lips of That same year she was proclaim- I 
Texas doughboys deep in the ] ed one of the outstanding Texas j 
trenches in France; the famous women in the field of music and
Cowboy Band of Hardin-Simmons 
University, Abilene, carried them 
again to Europe when they made 
their extensive tour of countries 
there. Perhaps in the last conflict, 
lonesome Texas G I’s sang snatch-

literary endeavors, and was fea­
tured in the book of Who’s Who 
of the Womanhood of Texas.

In 1936, 5,000 voices sang her 
Texas song at the opening session 
of the Texas Centennial, held in

es of her famous Texas song in Dallas, and she was invited to at-
trenches and foxholes all over the
globe.
Writes at Night

Born Ella Hudson, the daughter

tend as guest of the city. Sole | 
owner and publisher of the famous 
song, she only recently sold it to 
the Southern Music Company, in

tably bom into a family of mu­
sicians. Writing her first piano 
composition at the age of 10, music 
was to her what ice cream and

of William Haney Hudson and the,San Antonio. At one time, State 
former Sarah Jane Northcott, Superintendent L. A. Woods, con- 
plantation owners near Tehaucana, tracted for recordings of the song 
,n he Waco region she was ven- by the Brunswick Music Company,

-  fo r  us'  in  T e x a s  s c h o o ia. A t  a n ­

other time, the governor of the 
state conducted a statewide song 

. . >i . c o n t e s t ,  seeking a new Texas song,, 
cake was to most children. She can and jyjp* Day’s contribution o f1 
remember few days in all ner life Te PHde of the South, placed 
when some bewitching bit of song fir>t |n ^  district contest, and 
or music was not running through -#cow| ^  the slate To round out 
her head, seeking form on a musi- her muaical composing!. Mrs. Day 
cal sco re . Like most artiste, he onc€ wrote and thrice produced an j 
greatest works were born m the retu and a nrgro minstrel 
dead of night, with her family 
tucked snugly away. ' ‘

One of her greatest instrumental Write* Humor » oetry i
compositions, Bluella, was bom on 1 With poetry, fiction and newi- 
a “blue” Christmas night, to the paper feature writing always a 
accompaniment of the trio snor- j lesser, but no lea* pre-eminent 
mgs of her husband and two sons, creative endeavor, Mrs. Day won 
June and Dono. And like most a membership in the International 
artiste, she has to be in the mood Writer’s League in 1914, upon the 
for composing The recent loss of publication, in newspapers and j 
a lifelong friend prompted the j magazines throughout the south, [ 
composing of her greatest religious 
song, Thy Will Be Done, a dedicat­
ed prayer, set to music. The song, 
still in the manuscript, was intro­
duced for the first time recently 
when she was requested to sing it 
in the First Methodist Church 
services, Rotan, of which she is a 
member, and featured soloist in 
the church choir. She has been 
urged to have it published.

W Mr,l “ !.ry Ĉ  educated in Aus- Weepers had a k * , o f 5 2 5  
tin, studying music and voice, here in the old days for attracting 
there, and doing post graduate J new 
work in various other schools. She 
was music instructor in the schools 
at Comanche when she was mar

•••
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Old Storekeepers 
Had Novel Ideas 
For New Business

VERNON, TEX. (W NS).—Store-

ried to E. R. Day of DeLeon. The 
Days lived ten years in DeLeon 
before moving to Rotan the year 
it was organized.

With the'publication of her first 
great Texas song in 1909, and it's 
introduction at the opening ses­
sion of the Cotton Palace, in 
Waco, Mrs. Day plummeted to 
fame in the state and nation as an 
outstanding music composer and 
song writer. Invited to be guest of 
the city of Waco, during the Cot­
ton Palace seaiion, she sang her 
song, accompanied by the famous 

^Uberattt Ban< winning a bid to

business. The stores would 
open at 5:00 o'clock in the morn­
ing, and as soon as the floors were 
swept, the store clerks would grab 
a handful of circulars and dis­
tribute them at the wagon yard, 
where most visitors camped.

In the fall of the year, many 
families bought their winter sup­
plies all at one time. A  wagon 
would come into town carrying 
two bales of cotton, a man, his 
wife and his children. The clerks 
from the three stores here would 
run out and lift a child down and 
carry it into one of the stores, in 
hopes the parents would come 
there first. I f  they did, the store 
genesally got to sell them, .the 
whole bill of goods.
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Oklahoma Man and Son
Design Costumes for 
Ranch Women to Wear

Lsa County h  
Center

HOBBS, N M. (WNS).—The Per­
mian Basin, which underlies a 150 
mite radius of this cKy ki Texas 
and New Mexico, Is the largest oil 
producing area of Rs size in the 
world. Lea County, “Capitol of 
N*>w Mexico’s Oil Empire," lies 
right in the middle of this oil 
basin.

Although Lea, Eddy and Chavez 
Counties are pto-rated to 106,000 
barrels pewds^y, of which nearly 
80 per cent is produced in Lea 
County, the 1945 production was 
31,437,118 barrels.

Since the opening of this field in 
1930, Lea County has produced 
more than 400,000,000 barrels of 
crude oil. There are 4.000 produc­
ing wells in the county in 36 sep­
arate fields, with 44 new wells 
now being drilled. Depth ranges 
from 3,700 feet in the Eaves Field, 
to 12,000 feet in the Dublin Field. 
Eunice Monument Field, in this 
county, is one of the four largest 
in the world.

New Lab Gives Soil 
Analysis to Public

A soil testing laboratory has 
been set up at Texas A & M Col-

inalvsi

Buffalo Farmers 
Add Warehouse to* 
Grain Elevator

BUFFALO, OKLA. — WNS). — 
Owned by the Buffalo Farmers’
Cooperative, the new grain ele­
vator here te said to be one of 
the finest of its size in eight states. 
A new warehouse and feed mill 
have recently been added to the 
elevator which was completed in 
1945. The mill can produce about 
20 tons of feed per day.

The cooperative also owns ele­
vators Nl Selman and Lovedale, 
offering storage for 384,000 bushels 
of wheat. Coop members arc 
stockholders in the Union Equity 
Coop Exchange, Enid, and the 
Farmers’ Coop Commission com­
pany, Hutchinson, Kan., who 
handle the grain. A ll supplies for 
’the Buffalo members are bought 
from the Consumers’ Coop Asso­
ciation of Kansas City, in which 
they also tiold stock.

Begun in 1920, when It built an 
elevator in Buffalo, the Coop later 
bought the other two elevators. E. 
Bennett is president of the co­
operative, which now has 400
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REAL ESTATE

lege to make chemical analysis of members; Les Adams is secretary
soil samples, and is available to 
the public. Fees will be charged, 
ranging from 25 cents for PH tests 
to $7.50 for a complete analysis.

Information with reference to 
the soil, its use and location, 
should be included, and a form 
provided by the laboratory must 
be filled out and returned with the 
soil sample. These may be secured 
from county agricultural or home 
demonstration agents.

and E. E. Pereboom is manager 
During 1945 the company handl­

ed 506,000 bushels of wheat and 
sold $800,000 worth of feed, sup­
plies and the like for the members. 
Net savings for members during 
the year was $18,388. Wages paid 
to local people totaled $14,081, and 
$2,785 in taxes was paid. Half a 
dozen men are hired the year 
round, and during the busy season 
about nine more are employed.

BUY, SELL or TRADE Rc:*t K.talo ll will 
j pay to oftiilkol J. R. KI.L1STON. H* ivfofxl,
, Trxax. "BuilUillC Uio l'iUihumllt; f<*r 50
j ycum."
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Bedecked In snappy Western gwb are Lovilla Kay Frye, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Garnett Frye, and Denny Trego, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. L. O. Trego of Woodward. Okla. Trego and Sou supply 
simHar clothes for actors of Western movies.

* * * ♦ *

WOODWARD, OKLA. (W NS).—Just because women continue the 
remark. “ We have nothing to wear,” George L. Trego and his son, 
L. O. Trego, have a manufacturing business here second to none 
and are supplying women with costumes all over the nation.

In 1938 the elder Trego was chairman of a booster trip com­
mittee for the annual Elks Rodeo of Woodward. It was August and 
hot Women of the committee claimed they had nothing to wear on 
such trips and even the men agreed the customary western regalia 
of chaps, leather jackets and a l-*  
lied accoutrements, was too hot ‘
for comfort Trego said he would 
do something about i t  He did. 
Finds Cool Material

Traveling to Kansas City In 
search of cooler western materials, 
Trego found a light weight pin- 
wheel corduroy material. He 
launched a designing business of­
fering a bolera motif with match­
ing and contrasting shirt combina­
tions. The idea caught on among 
the women. It was not only a cool 
ensemble but most attractive.

Orders poured in for the new 
costumes, so father and son 
teamed up to found a manufac­
turing plant. New model* were re­
quested; new designs offered the 
public. In eight short years the 
factory has grown into a major 
industry featuring complete lines 
of rodeo costumes.

The Trego factory boasts cut­
ting machines, machines for sew­
ing leather, suede, corduroy and 
gaberdine machines, all used in 
turning out complete Western cos­
tumes appealing to contestant and 
spectator alike. Price range runs 
from the most expensive down to 
leatherette garments in reach of 
the most conservative. Boys and 
girls are as eager customers of the 
Trego’s as the world champion 
cowboys.
Specialises to Styles

Novelties and souvenirs are 
available in all sizes and classifi­
cations. But Trego’s specialize in 
fitting the most exacting man, 
woman and child in smart styles 
and superb materials.

The Trego files are filled with 
wholesale orders from Canada, 
Mexico and each of the 48 United 
States.

On Sunset Boulevard, Holly­
wood, Cal., the movie capital of 
the world, Mrs. Pearl Allen, a 
daughter of the manufacturer, 
caters to the Western needs of 
the stars. Her duplicate sales tick­
ets include such familiar names as 
Allen Ladd, Roy Rogers, Ozzie 
Nelson, Robert Montgomery, Joan 
Bennett, Victor Mature, Mary 
Pick ford, and Gehe Autry from 
the movie colony and scores of 
celebrities In other fields who 
make her. store headquarters for 
individual and attractive attire. 
She'attributes her success in busl-t 
ness not only to these famous cli­
ents but to others who visit her 
store to “star gaze” and remain to 
trade.
U u  W—Urn UkAn

go and Son have a shop for Dad 
and Lad housed in strictly West­
ern atmosphere. Here a rail fence 
and harness peg coat rack, and 
other familiar Western scenes dec­
orate the store. All items manu­
factured are offered for sale in 
this corral of Western sports wear. 
It boasts the most complete West­
ern stock in Oklahoma.

Trego contends if women will 
just keep on complaining about | 
not having anything to wesr, give 
him an idea of the occasion, he 
and his son will continue to en­
large their manufacturing busi­
ness with styles to offset any 
complaint or weather or event

County Agent Is 
Busy Despite the 
Absence of Farms

R A N K I N ,  TEX. (W NS).— 
Without a single farm in Upton 
County, C. Snell, county agent, 
finds himself Just as busy as his 
brothers in the farming regions, 
for the country produces many 
sheep and cattle. Snell points out 
the advantages to ranchers of this 
combination, since sheep eat the 
small grass, while cattle graze on 
and keep down the large grass. 
Sheep also browse on the shrubs, 
black brush, mesquite, cat-claw, 
and tommetia.

T. D. Workman, secretary and 
treasurer of the Wool House here 
reports they sold a million and a 
quarter pounds of wool last year, 
with 1,800,000 pounds of wool on 
storage the first of this year, 
and half a million pounds in stor­
age now. The Wool House is own­
ed by ranchmen ol the area, with 
no one person owning over six 
shares. Most wool is shipped to 
San Angelo. During the war the 
government was the only wool 
buyer, but nowadays anyone can 
buy, though purchases have been 
small because of the high price.

Real China Dishes 
Came In With Hotel
(Condensed from Vernon Times)
Vernon, Tex — (WNS) —Chir a 

dishes, called “human” dishes by 
the cowboys, made their first ap- 

hwo W  fa *  ft JofiPnhnnftron/to

‘Sharpshooter’ Shoots 
Juice in Lightning Rods

MEMPHIS, TEX. (WNS).—A “ Sharpshooter,”  contrary to defi­
nitions of those handling spades or garden instruments, also means 
one who sees a profit in a certain transaction and takes advantage of 
the offer or people involved. It is a term given to “high-pressure” 
salesmen whose duties border close to rackets.

A sharpshooter was talking in a f  
local hotel here recently, and his 
name must be withheld for obvious 
reasons; he denied his business 
was a racket but recalled a story 
about his father who was an oil 
promoter in West Texas during 
the boom days. It merely proves 
how gullible some people can be 
and is another instance of citizens 
making it easy for sharpshooters 
to operate.
Goes Broke

It seems this promoter had tried 
all of his wiles in the vicinity of 
Electra, Vernon, Ranger and other 
fields of the region and soon 
found himself not only broke but 
had to raise money in a hurry or 
face a judge.

Sitting in his room one night, he 
noticed the old-fashioned tele-

Khone on the wall; the type one 
ad to crank to get the operator.
He hâ d an idea!
He removed the magneto from 

inside the phone box, took the 
crank and two wires from the wall 
and then studied his county maps.
He was ready now to enter a new 
business venture.

The following morning he bor­
rowed a friend's car and took to 
the country roads. He was search­
ing for certain types of farm 
homes, those which had lightning 
rods on the roof.
Never Missed a Sale 

Using all of his masterful sales­
manship knowledge, the promoter 
knocked at each door, smiled at 
the occupant and informed the 
owner of the home he was a 
special representative of some 
non-existent lightning rod com­
pany. He was making the territory 
for the express purpose of “ re­
charging all lightning rods” in 
Texas. His fee was only $5 per 
house and when he had completed 
his scientific duties “your rods 
will again be able to withstand all 
attacks of an angry heaven.” 

lie never missed a sale. No one 
thought but what such service was 
reasonable. He merely attached his 
two telephone wires to the ground 
cable of each house, turned his 
crank and showed his customers 
the sparks which flew from the 
magneto, through the wires to the 
lightning rod ground. His entire 
operation merely required a half- 
dozen turns of the crank.

The promoter's son avers Ms 
father made more than $1,000 In 
less than five days in this “new 
business venture.” He added jus 
father used this money to buy still 
more oil leases for a larger 
gamble.

He also declared his father had thereby reducing the power n< 
used the "charging” stunt in prac- *ary to operate by over 50 
tically every region of Texaa. cent

B. O. Retires
QUANAH. TEX. (W N S ).— 

B. O. Jr. te probably the only 
goat ever recorded In the ar­
chives of a municipal govern­
ment. Mayor Rex Sullivan of 
Quanah proclaimed the city’s 
first billy-goat ordinance In be­
half of Quanah's annual rodeo 
laat May. Anyone caught not 
wearing appropriate Western 
apparel waa chained to B. O. 
until soluble clothing was ob­
tained.

Some took the goat-riding In 
tun, others didn’t —  but all 
wound up with Western garb, 
rich and poor alike. At times, 
the victims would have te pa­
rade through several stores 
with the wild long horned goat 
before finding their bond.

Currently, B. O. te nibbling 
on gram and tin cans. He 
doesn’t appear to be very much 
concerned about bio days of 
glory.

Texans Separate 
Cream With Aid of 
High Plains Wind

VEGA, TEX. (WNS). — Texas 
wind, an abundant native prod­
uct, will furnish power for pump­
ing water, operating cream sep­
arators, emery wheels and small 
feed grinders, when Allen Stagg 
gets into commercial production 
with hte newly invented wind 
mill.. The mill has automatic speed 
control, automatic dutch fly 
wheels, and line shaft with pul­
leys.

Invented when Stagg, ex-cow­
boy and sheriff, was convalescing 
from a long illness, the mill is 
expected to pump twice as much 
water as an ordinary windmill 
and to provide free electric power 
for many farm tasks.

The wheel is designed to pull 
or roll itself into the wind, thus 
requiring no weights or tension 
springs, and an arrangement of 
side and tell vanes permits main­
tenance of balance, pressure and 
resistance. To be built a con- 

is venient distance from the well, 
the mill Is to be connected to a 
counter-balanced walking beam, 
such as those used Ui the oil fields, 
thereby reducing the power neces-

per
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Clay Deposits in 
Eastland County 
In Big Demand

By J. H. TANNER 
Ewitland Chamber of Commerce 

Manager
EASTLAND, TEX. (W N S ).— 

Ceramic clays of Eastland County 
are coming to the front as a valu­
able potential industry. While 
these clays have been used for 
some time, only recently has suf­
ficient interest been shown to 
make deposits of industrial value 
to the area.

Eastland County clay Is now be­
ing shipped as far east as Pitts­
burg. and. potteries in Austin 
are buying in large quantities. In­
quiries are coming in daily from 
northern and eastern manu­
facturers.

The Electric Service Co., which 
supplies this area with power, re­
cently* completed two engineering 
reports to further the development 
of ceramics. These reports give 
data on clay deposits, showing 
their value in the manufacture of 
dinnerware and porcelain insu­
lators. Another survey by a north­
ern sewer pipe company has led 
to plans for construction of such 
an industry here.

A $70,000 plant for the manu­
facture of porcelain spool insu­
lators for electric*power distribu­
tion, to use clay from this county, 
is now under construction. The 
company also plans on the manu­
facture of Mexican and Indian 
arte.

In 1933 Guy Quinn, Sr., started 
a business with, a capital of $50. 
Quinn today has an investment of 
$250,000, a plant covering nine 
acres, and clay deposits from 200 
acres. This company employes a 
staff of 140, mostly middle-aged 
and*handicapped workers, and has 
developed a nationwide market for 
pottery novelties, vases, and orna­
ments.
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PACE Iff

IiOwly Pea Is 
Proving To Be 
A Money Maker

LAMESA, TEX. (W NS).—Peas 
offer a variety of suggestions to 
the housewife. There are cow peas, 
black-eye peas, golden spring peas, 
green peas and even creamed peas 
are now being canned for daily 
consumption, but Dawson County 
farmers have found a new profit­
paying crop in the old-time variety 
of black-eye peas as raised in 
acre after acre of producing soil 
in this region.

All of my life I have been told
to eat black-eye peas on New 
Year’s Day for good luck through­
out the ensuing year. A sheriff up 
at Amarillo started the fad all over 
again a few years ago—declaring 
those who ate peas on the first 
day of the year would have noth­
ing but good luck. The pea indus- 
tiy has been swamped ever since 
with orders.
Make Big Profit

Rut T. A. Barfield, county agent 
of Dawson County, has a different 
explanation for the new West Tex­
as agricultural industry.

Dry weather, late seasons and 
other acts of nature make the 
Wr t Texas farmer versatile and 

* 'more resourceful. Last year the 
season was too late for cotton, 
grain sorghums and other regional 
crops in Dawson County so furm- 

j ers turned to black-eye peas, many 
with tongue in check. As a result, 
however, they realized from $25 
to $35 per acre net on their land 
after paying laborers from $12 
to $15 per day to harvest and 
gather the crop.

More than $500,000 in net prof­
its were earned in Dawson Coun­
ty from the harvest of black-eye 
peas, the past season.

Now the lowly pea promises to 
become another major industry for 
Lamcsa and vicinity. The local 
chamber of commerce, realizing 
the need for such progress, has 
held conferences with East Texas 
firms relative to locating a pea 
cannery within the city limits.
Plan New Cannery

Between three and four million 
pounds of black-eye peas har­
vested locally were sold to two 
canneries at Husk, Tex., from 
which growers received between 
$110,000 and $150,000. Huge trailer 
trucks were utilized to transport 
peas to market, making a round 
trip each 24 hours.

N. B. Hall, heading a group o f1 
half-dozen buyers purchasing the 
Lamesa pea crop, said they planned 
on a new cannery here within the 
near future or locating between 
and Brownfield, the production 
area. The cannery, he declared, 
would accommodate growers In 
New Mexico who raise fruit in 
season. He said a cannery utiliz­
ing peas, fruit and other vege­
tables grown in this region would 
insure full-time operation.

Barfield pointed out the pea 
crop was planted late in Dawson ! 
County last year, most peas being 1 
planted after July 15, but added 1 
next year would find peas planted 
between June 15 and 25. This, he 
said, would give time for a sec- 

. ond crop. He added this early 
planting would not interfere with 
the East Texas season, assuring 
better prices and available pick­
ers.

Dawson County has decided peas 
are good luck the year ’round when 
planted as a crop.

Frederick C of C
Provides Homes_ •
For War Veterans

FREDERICK, OKLA. (W NS).— 
Homes for Veterans, the new bat­
tle-cry of the nation, is not a slo­
gan but a fact In this Oklahoma 
town. Rooms and apartments have 
been made available to many 
Frederick veterans through effort)? 
of the Chamber of Commerce.

When the army air field was 
established here early in the war, 
the government built apartments 
as a federal public housing project 
for migratory civilian war workers 
at a cost of $148,000, including a 
girls’ dormitory.

This housing project is now open 
to war veterans. The dormitory 
contains 33 single rooms, while 
the apartments include six one- 
room efficiencies, 18 one-bedroom 
apartments, 24 with two bedrooms, 
and 12 with three bedrooms. They 
rent for $22.50 up to $32. The gov­
ernment guarantees payment of 
rent during periods of unemploy­
ment.

Reavers, the only ones within 
800 miles, have built a dam on 
Big Mineral Bay, Lake Texhoma.

Ashes of burned money c*n be 
analyzed and redeemed.

Champion Quarter Horse Is Moved From Texas Home
STINNF.TT, TEX. (WNS).—Texas lost a great horse to its neighbor when W. S. Starnes took 

Cowboy Mike, a quarter horse stallion, to his recently purchased ranch at Springer, N. M., this
spring.

Cowboy Mike has won the Grand Championship at every show he has entered: Amarillo, Trx„ 
1944, Albuquerque, N. M.. 1043, and Eagle Pass. Tex., 1944, and his show days aren't over.

Starnes plans to show the famous stallion at Fort Worth in 1947.
Cowboy Mike was sired by Straight Shot and his dam was the Little Mike Mare. His lineage on 

both sides goes bark to Peter Mc4’ue. and to Upset, the only horse to outrun Man o’ War.

Por ta les  Students 
Form Own Vet-ville

PORTALES, N. M. (WNS).—A considerable amount of trouble 
was undertaken to establish Vetville, the southern portion of Eastern 
New Mexico College campus which now houses some 110 veterans 
and their families.

Army barracks of Fort Sumner, N. M., were sawed in half and 
then transported 68 miles to the college. Sewage pipes had to be dug 
UR from the Fort Sumner foundations.

But the houses eventually found their new location—much to the
relief of veterans attending the*--------------------------------------
col lege and a few non-collegiate
veterans who could find no other 
home.
105 Units

The 150 units which now stand 
in the ville are but a taste of what 
is to be— another 100 unit* are on
the way.

Uncle Sam’s usual allotment of 
the houses has dwindled to 20 
units. Other colleges, now scream­
ing for the abodes, are puzzled at 
the unusual generosity handed to 
Eastern New Mexico College.

Floyd D. Golden, president of 
the college, is the answer. When 
the government first started the; 
handouts, Golden got on his toes 
and filed applications. Other col­
leges were studying the possi­
bilities of the arrangement while 
Golden doggedly plunged into the 
red tape.
Still Working

The energetic president is still 
plugging. More than 400 veterans 
made applications for this term, 
and the demand for the houses 
had to be satisfied. With 400 new 
veterans coming in, the enroll­
ment of Eastern New Mexico Col­
lege will double.

Vetville is now bathed in the 
dust stirred up by a crew of 
plumbers, painters and carpenters 
—the conglomeration of hurried 
activity smirks of poetic injustice 
to what was once a peaceful wheat 
field. This dusty protest will be 
short-lived, for curbing is going 
in, and the roadways and alleys 
are being hard surfaced.

Only the election of a mayor is 
needed to give the little city a 
complete village status. The roads, 
alleys and other facilities were laid 
out according to studied planning. 
A plot capable of holding four of 
the five unit barracks is being 
transformed into a playground 
park for the children.
Build Playground

The playground park will be a

special blessing to the 30 veterans 
who have offspring.

Also village-like is the service 
arrangement. Milk, papers and 
mail will be delivered daily, and 
the garbage will be tended by the 
city. All this, at $20 per month.

Five living units are in each 
barrack. Each unit consists of • 
dinette, a kitchen, a bath room, 
storage space and one or two bed

rooms. Refrigerators, stoves, hot 
water heaters and deep sinks 
adorn the kitchens. The rest of the 
iiouse is bedecked with solid maple 
furniture.
Houses Alio ted

To become a part of the $200,- 
000 arrangement, veterans must 
file application with Dr. Eunice 
Roberts, director of personnel at 
the college. It is she who parcels 
out the presents according to 
priority. '

Married veterans attending the 
college are given first choice.

1 Single vets of the college are sec­
ond, and non-college veterans who 
are unable to find homes are next. 
Four of these “distressed” ex-G.I ’s 
are members of vetville’s society.

Just when the other 100 units 
will arrive is problematical, but 
Golden maintains that his veterans 
can fill them up as soon as con­
struction is completed.
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Cimarron River 
Gets Name From 
Wandering Cattle

CIMARRON, OKLA. (W NS).—. 
Of Spanish origin, the word “Cim­
arron” moans a wandering animal 
which will not stay in one place 
and the river of this name was so 
called by Spanish buffalo hunters 
in the old days because ot its 
meandering course.

But geographically Cimarron 
County is located in the western 
end of the Panhandle of Okla­
homa, 54 miles long from east to 
west and 34 miles wide from 
north to south.

Cattlemen will tell you Cimar­
ron means wandering cow, and are 
proud of the namesake. Approxi­
mately 700,0Q0 acres are devoted 
to grazing within the county bord­
ers and about 30,000 head of cat­
tle roam the range.

Ranchmen have practiced run­
ning pure-bred sires for the past 
30 years and today’s cowboy rid­
ing the ranch lands believes the 
majority of the herds are of high 
class registered cattle.

The two oldest ranches to have 
operated within the county are the 
old ZH ranch near Boise City, and 
the original 101 ranch near Ken­
ton.

Loaded Wagons With 
Eye On Tough Hill
(Condensed from Vernon Times)

Vernon, Tex.— (WNS). —Road 
tests, in the days before paved 
streets and automobiles simplified 
travel, were necessary to see how 
much of a load a wagon could pull. 
County wagons were loaded ac­
cording to the heaviest load that 
could be pulled across the square 
or over the Byars hill on the road 
to Oklaunion.

It took a good team of horses to 
pull a 2,000 pound load to Okla­
union, and the Byars hill was the 
Jonah. It was deep sand and many 
teams stalled trying to make the 
grade.
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