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Joe Barton carries Cooke County... 	
kP 

Hutchison, Krueger need 	' 
runoff to decide senatorial race 

Voters went to the polls on 
Saturday, May 1 to elect a senator 
to fill the unexpired term of Lloyd 
Benison. Bentson vacated his seat in 
the US Senate to serve as Treasury 
Secretary for the Clinton 
administration. Also to be decided 
by voters was whether the three 
propositions dealing with • school 
financing would pass into state law. 

Muenster voters showed a strong 
interest in the election and turned 
out in numbers much larger than 
anticipated. "I had to call the county 

than I thought there would be," she 
said. "I think it was more Barton 
than anything." 

Cooke County came out strong 
for Joe Barton. He carried the 
county with 2,048 votes. Kay Bailey 
Hutchison and Bob Krueger got the 
most votes across the state. The 
winner will be determined in a run-
off election sometime in June. 

The three proposed constitutional 
amendments were nixed by Cooke 
County voters. A majority of voters 
across the state opposed them also. 

clerk, Frank Scoggins, to get more 
ballots," remarked Precinct 18 
election judge Mary Lee Hennigan. 
It was steady all day. There were 
never more than a couple of minutes 
that there weren't people voting." 
There were 550 voters from 
Precinct 18 exercising the right to 
vote. 

Precinct 17 also had a good turn 
out with Janet Fisher, election judge 
noting that they had about a 50 
percent turn out with 147 people 
voting. "There were more voters 

COOKE COUNTY ELECTION RESULTS  
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United States Senator Unexpired Tenn 
Joe Barton Republican 
Kay Bailey Hutchison. Republican 
Robert (Bob) Krueger. Democrat 
Bacharillishmilmacsat 
Jack Fields. Republicpp 
Jose Antlel Gutienn. Democrat 

THREE NEW MEMBERS are now on the Muenster City Council after the May 3 election and appointment to 
an unexpired term. At the Monday Council meeting are, 1 to r, back - alderman Arthur Hennigan; newly-elected 
Mike Trubenbach; Rick Stewart, appointed to Aubry Tuggle's unexpired term; front - alderman Marianne Grant; 
newly-elected mayor Bill Miller; and alderman Fran Voth. Watch for the full Council meeting story next week. 

Dave Felts Photo 
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Proposed Constitutional Amendments 
Proposition #1 

For 
Against 
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Against 

Proposition #3 
For 
Against 

Two incumbents ousted in election 
There will be several new faces 

on the Muenster Memorial Hospital 
Board of Directors when the newly 
elected candidates are sworn in at 
the May 26 board meeting. The 
positions of two incumbents, Al 
Felderhoff and Sharon Felderhoff, 
were upset when the final votes 
were tallied in the May 1 election. 

There were six candidates vying 
for four seats on the board in the at 
large election. Sam Endres and Stan 
Endres tied for the most voters with 

new member Earl Cunningham. 
Metzler had 230 votes, Bezner had 
189 votes and Cunningham had 189 
votes to secure places on the school 
board for three-year terms. Also 
running for the positions were 
Michael Bengfort, who received 
158 votes and Skipper Seiner who 
received 110 votes. 

Valley View will have a new 
mayor as Cecil Neu received 59 
votes to take that position running 
unopposed. He will replace Owen 
Roane, who did not seek re-election. 
Two incumbents will return as 
aldermen on the town council. 
Danny Martindale received 57 votes 
and Jimmy Nickerson received 47 
votes to secure their positions for 
two more years. J. D. Johnson was 

by Elaine Schad 
Several new faces will Join 

incumbents on city councils and 
schools boards in the area following 
Saturday's election. 

In Lindsay, Robert Walterscheid 
will continue as mayor, receiving 
116 votes running unopposed for 
the city council. Andy Arendt, John 
Sandmann and Pat Bowman are 
new town aldermen. Arendt 
received 135 votes, Sandmann 
received 129 votes and Bowman 
received 107 votes. Other 
candidates running included Matt 
Bezner, who received 63 votes, and 
Richard Alfrey, who had 57 votes. 

Incumbents Susan Metzler and 
Andy Bezner were returned to the 
Lindsay school board along with 

election • results reported 
another candidate, receiving 13 
votes. 

Incumbents were returned to the 
Valley View school board as two 
ran unopposed for their three-year 
positions. School Board President 
Ernie Brinkley received 107 votes 
and board member Jerry Neighbors 
received 114 votes. 

In Era, two incumbents will also 
continue to serve for three more 
years as they ran unopposed in the 
school board election. Carl Enderby 
received 104 votes and Tunbo Selby 
received 116 votes. 

Write-in votes for the Era board 
included Mike Selby with 3 votes. 
Junior Worthey with 2 votes, while 
Harold Bowles and Bill Linen each 
received one vote. 

Muenster School Board 
Election 

359 apiece. Margie Starke, another 
incumbent, received 343 votes. 
Jerry Hess followed with 285. Al 
Felderhoff totaled 268 votes and 
Sharon Felderhoff 229. 

There were 498 ballots cast in the 
election. It was an unusually high 
voter turn out for the hospital 
election. The votes were canvassed 
at a special meeting called for 
Tuesday morning and the official 
results were reported by Jack 
Endres, administrator. 

Tom Flusche and Annette 
Anderle ran unopposed for the two 
expiring terms on the Muenster ISD 
School Board. Flusche received 454 
votes and Anderle 452. There were 
485 voters taking part in the 
election. "It was a real good turn 
out," commented Steve Cooper 
Mueniter ISD Superintendent. 

'Sacred Heart School praised in Metanoia evaluation 
For the second time in two years, 

Sacred Heart School has been 
rigorously evaluated. Last year, an 
accreditation visiting team from the 
Southern Association of Colleges 
and Schools, a nationally-
recognized regional accrediting 
association, pronounced Sacred 
Heart School a model school which 
other schools should emulate. This 
year, the Office of Education of the 
Fort Worth Diocese commissioned 
The Metanoia Group, an 
independent group of educational 
consultants, to evaluate each of the 
schools belonging to the Fort Worth 
Diocese. In addition to providing 
each school with the result of the 
extensive evaluation, The Metanoia 

breadth of its high school 
curriculum. 

Group is serving the Diocese by 
developing a mission statement and 
strategic plan for all schools of the 
Diocese. He reserved his highest praise for 

the students of Sacred Heart School. 
Mr. Burchill said, "If the eight 
students who participated in the 
student focus group represented the 
student body at Sacred Heart High 
School, then the school is blessed 
with some of the most intelligent, 
mature, insightful, good-willed 
young adults it has ever been the 
privilege of The Metanoia Group to 
meet. The people of Muenster have 
every right and OBLIGATION to 
be proud and supportive of these 
wonderful young people." 

Mr. Burchill made several 

recommendations as part of his 
report. They were: aggressively 
encourage major gifts for the Trust 
Fund; aggressively promote wills, 
bequests and other planned gifts for 
the school; pursue recruitment of 
students from outside Muenster; and 
support the implementation of the 
interactive television project. 

In closing his report, Mr. Burchill 
said that Sacred Heart School in 
Muenster was one of the most 
unique, special and outstanding 
schools he had encountered in his 
years of evaluating and advising 
schools throughout the nation. 
Written copies of his report were 
made available to the school. 

Mr. T.J. Burchill III, president of 
The Metanoia Group, presented a 
report of his findings to a group 
composed of faculty, parents, 
students, school board members and 
community leaders at Sacred Heart 
School on April 26. Mr. Burchill 
stated that, "Sacred Heart School is 
an extraordinary example of what 
dedicated people can accomplish in 
Catholic education." Perhaps the 
most important finding reported by 
Mr. Dunhill was his statement that, 
"The Metanoia Group has worked 

needs, the hardships and the 
contributions of all the other groups. 
Faculty and board members are 
universally enthusiastic about the 
principal; the principal is generous 
in his praise of the board and the 
faculty; the students share the views 
of their parents and they love their 
teachers; the teachers love their 
students and praise the board for its 
efforts to advance the school." 

Mr. Burchill cited Sacred Heart 
School for its caring atmosphere, its 
emphasis on promoting and 
fostering spiritual growth and its 
academic strength at all levels of the 
school. Mr. Burchill also 
commended the school for its very 
high academic standards and the 

extensively in Catholic schools 
from coast to coast. From its 
perspective, the single most 
distinctive characteristic of Sacred 
Heart School is this: 

"Every individual and every 
group with which The Metanoia 
Group interacted shares a common 
positive view of the mission, 
strengths, challenges, issues, 
priorities and value of Sacred Heart 
School. 

"This unanimity of attitude is 
unprecedented in the experience of 
The Metanoia Group. Every 
constituent (parents, board, students 
and faculty) has the greatest respect 
and admiration for the work, the 

Rock Creek Farm offers handcrafted 
furniture and gifts in new location 

S 

wood of their choice. "We'll make 
or try to make anything that the 
customer wants," Paul remarked. 
"We don't use plywood -- plywood 
is for houses. Everything is 
guaranteed. Pine gives a little and if 
it is extreme we'll fix it." 

Mary Mason of Corinth, Paul's 
mother, makes baskets and wreaths 
for the store. She has a gift shop at 
Lake Dallas where her creations are 
sold also 

"We get ideas from magazines," 
said Janie. "We will make items 
from magazine pictures or photos." 
Some of the merchandise is 
seasonal - Christmas and some 
Easter. There are many items that 
would be suitable for a teacher as an 
end of the year gift. 

Some of eye-catching smaller 
items include decorated woodel 
boots, clowns, chickens, dragons, 
cows, whales, tulips, salt boxes, and 
Southwest decor. 

Rock Creek Farm has been open 
at its new location for four weeks. A 
ribbon cutting is planned for 
Monday. There will be a Grand 
Opening after all of the remodeling 
is complete. 

PAUL VALENTINE, left, skillfully cuts a wood piece for an item that he is making to sell in Rock Creek 
Farm. Janie Valentine, right, puts the finishing touches on one of Paul's large handcrafted wooden tulips. They 
have moved their business into the former Fischerhaus location and have many items ready to sell. 

Janie Hart man Photo 

by Janet Felderhoff 
Paul and Janie Valentine have 

recently moved their furniture 
design and custom building 
business, Rock Creek Farm, to 221 
N. Oak in Muenster. They 
specialize in hand-crafted pine 
wood pieces. 

The new location is the former 
home of Fischerhaus. It is ideal for 
displaying the many pieces of 
country furniture and decorative 
shelves, wall plaques, etc. 

Paul does the wood cutting and 
building. He has moved his 
equipment into the back of the 
business. Before the move he 
worked at home and rented spaces 
in various businesses to sell his 
merchandise. 

Rock Creek Farms needed a 
location to put custom pieces on 
display. Rented spaces don't work 
as well since you need to be there to 
take orders, Paul explained. When 
Fischerhaus was moved to Main 
Street Paul and Janie took the 
opportunity to move into the 
landmark building. 

Paul has been doing woodwork 
for seven years. His grandfathers 

both had an interest in woodwork. 
One built furniture and the other 
made some pieces for his home. 

Janie does the painting and puts 
the color on the furniture. She also 
makes the copper and tin punch 
pieces. The custom made mock 
stained glass is Janie's creation. 
They are made from an unbreakable 
material and add to the beauty of 
several of the wood pieces. 

In the future the couple hopes to 
make some genuine stained glass 
and possibly get into making pottery 
such as dinnerware. 

"We build future heirlooms," said 
Paul of his custom pieces. 
"Everything is guaranteed," said 
Valentine. "Customers don't pay 
until they know that they like it." 

Merchandise available includes 
shelves, bedroom furniture, dining 
room furniture, country plaques, 
fireplace mantles, occasional tables, 
desks, and window cornices with 
sun catchers. He has made complete 
built-in entertainment centers and 
built-in bars for houses. Most of 
Paul's furniture is made from pine 
wood, but if the customer requests 
hard wood he will make it out of the 



grant was for the tri-county area 
(Cooke, Fannin, and Grayson). At 
that meeting about 12 people 
volunteered to go to Houston to a 
training seminar ID learn how to be 
a coalition and to build a 
Partnership. OSAP gave a week 
long training on what to do. 

While in Houston the group 
determined what their vision, 
mission, and strategies would be. 

policy 	*promoting early 
intervention developing life skills 
*training community impactors. 

TCP has four staff members and 
around 300 volunteers. Bonnie 
Estes is the manager, Vicki Cowling 
the program planner, Ronda Bliey 
the media coordinator, and Annette 
White is secretary. 

"One of the things that we 
noticed was that people weren't used 

BRENDA RIGSBY, left, and Vicki Cowling discuss Cooke County's 
most recent Texoma Community Partnership Networking Committee 
news. Brenda is one of many Cooke County volunteers for TCP and saves 
on the Media Committee. Vicki is the TCP staff program planer. 
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and employees at the municipal, 
county, state and federal levels. 
TSA is the largest chapter of the 
National Safety Council. 

Judge Russell stated that Cooke 
County began its comprehensive 
ongoing safety program in August 
1991. The Loss Control (Safety) 
Committee, chaired by EMS 
Director Bob Harbin, is made up of 
14 county employees who assist the 
various departments in establishing 
safety policies, procedures, and 
training classes which protects 
employees, the public and the 
environment Judge Russell stressed 
that the excellent work of Mr. 
Harbin and that committee has 
resulted in the 35% reduction in lost 
workdays due to injuries. As a result 
of that reduction, Cooke County 
realized a $37,573 reduction in 
Workers' Compensation pre.nunms 
for fiscal year 1993. Judge Russell 
commends the employees of Cooke 
County, as well as the members of 
that committee, for their excellent 
work in achieving this substantial 
savings for the county. 
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Sunday, May9 Thursday, May 13 

SH Athletic Banquet MOTHERS DAY 

Monday, May 10 
VFW Meeting, 8 p.m. 
Muenster Jr. High 
Al-Awards Banquet, 7 p.m. 
Beta Kappa Installation 620 
Ladies VFW Auxiliary 
Installation, 8 p.m. 
SH School Board, 710 p.m. 

Saturday, May 15 

ARMED FORCES DAY 

Friday, May 14 

SH Elementary Field Day 
UIL State Track Meet 
Senior/Faculty Volleyball Game, 
2:45 p.m., MHS gym 
Hornet Band Concert, 2 p.m. 

Wednesday, May 12 
Religious Ed. Party 
VFW Gin Tourney, 7 pm. 

Tuesday, May 11 
4-H Meeting, 7 pm. 
SH School Board, 720 p.m. 
C of C Luncheon, The Center 
Muenster Hfgth School 
All Awards Banquet,  6:30 p.m. 

MISD Book Fair Week 

Sunday, May 16 Tuesday, May 18 Monday, May 17 

SH Sr. Awards Banquet 7 p.m 

Saturday, May 22 Wednesday, May 19 

MISD Kindergarten 
Graduation 7 p.m. 

Thursday, May 20 

Ascension Thursday 
SH - No School 

Friday, May21 

MHS Graduation 
MISD report cards issued 
MI SD Dismisses 2:30 p.m 
Last Day of School 
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Letters to the Editor 	  Networking is big plus of 
Texoma Community Partnership 
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I 	 
however. other events such as those 
I have noted above man reporting. 
What is happening with the leaders 
of the Muenster community, and 
who are they? Who has moved back 
to Muenster? How are the town's 
farming and oil industries? Some 
interesting personality profiles. 
perhaps even including former 
Muenster residents, would be 
interesting_ As a "Muenster Alta" 
who remains deeply committed and 
connected to my hometown, I miss 
learning about what is happening in 
Muenster in the city's newspaper! 

Thank you for your consideration 
and I look forward to receiving 
future publications of The 
Muenster Enterprise with 
expanded coverage of the Muenster 
community. 

Sincerely, 
Anselma Felderhoff Wright 

99 Haverill Way 
San Antonio, DX 78209 
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Dear Mr. Fette, 
In renewing my annual 

subscription to The Muenster 
Enterprise, I want to make the 
following comments. I hope you 
will receive them in the spirit in 
which they are given. 

I look to my hometown 
newspaper to keep me 'informed as 
to what is happening to my friends 
and relatives since I left Muenster 
30-plus years ago: who has been 
back home visiting, which 
Mnensterites have been traveling, 
how the economy is faring and, in 
general, what events are own' g 
m Muenster as well as highlights of 
activities in the surrounding 
coniminirnes 

During the last few years, The 
Muenster Enterprise's focus has 
been on school news - athletics, 
drama, cheerleaders, all of which 
are most important to a community, 

by Janet Felderhoff 
"The whole idea behind the 

Partnership grant was that one 
person can have an impact, but if 
you get a hundred people in one 
community working on it (the same 
project) you're going to have a 
hundred times the impact," 
explained Vicki Cowling, program 
planner for Texoma Community 
Partnership CfCP). "That is the hope 
and the goal of the Partnerships. It 
is the concept behind Partnership." 

There are 251 Partnerships across 
the United States. Thirteen are in 
Texas. The programs are 100-
percent federally funded by the 
Center for Substance Abuse 
Prevention. Each Partnership grant 
is issued for a total of five years. It 
is hoped that at the aid of the five-
year period, the groups that formed 
because of the Partnership grant will  
have becomg self-suffficient and 
self-supported. If they aren't, then 
the group or groups and their 
projects will fold with the ending of 
the grant 

"Eventually when the committee 
says. this is a project, we're going to 
be able to sit back and support 
them, do all of the mail-outs and the 
committee will do all of the work," 
noted Vicki "None of them are 
autonomous yet If they don't get to 
where they can work by themselves 
then they won't be able to carry on 
once the grant is no longer funded. 
Every time we go to meetings we 
see new faces and we can't expect 
them to operate on their own yet" 

A good part of the first couple 
of years has been spent determining 
what the needs are. Every year more 
needs come up. The Center for 
Substance Abuse and Prevention 
has recently asked that TCP start 
looking at violence prevention and 
tobacco prevention. 

The best way for volunteers to 
help is to select the area that most 
concerns them and to find a 
committee to work with. There are 
many committees already working 
in a variety of areas and all 
welcome volunteers. 

About six months after the grant 
was awarded to the COG (Texoma 
Council of Governments), staff was 
hired and the first meeting held. The 

Finnell gains bi-partisan 
senate support for 2-way TV 

Vicki noted that it was a tough 
struggle at first because people 
weren't accustomed to working with 
each other. They were used to 
depending on themselves. Also. 
many thought that working together 
would cut their funding. On the 
contrary, the government is now 
more easily funding groups that can 
prove that they are collaborating. 

There are now more than 40 
people representing a wide variety 
of organizations and groups 
networking in Cooke County. Some 
of the resulting programs are the 
Lexington Square Apartment 
Program in Gainesville and a 50011-
to-be-published student health 
directory listing available resources. 
The Lexington Square Apt. Program 
wasn't funded by TCP, but did 
receive guidance from it. An after 
school program was established in 
the apartment building for 
underprivileged youth. 

All committees in the Texoma 
Partnership are set up to meet once 
monthly. The full Partnership meets 
once per quarter in a collective 
effort, with quarterly newsletters 
issued for distributing information 
throughout the Partnership. The 
Citizens Council consists of a 
chairperson from each existing 
committee and acts as a governing 
body for the Partnership. 

There are around 11 committees 
whose work affects the people of 
Cooke County. Some of these are 
the Cooke County Multicultural 
Committee whose purpose is to 
review multicultural needs within 
Cooke County and to make 
recommendations to TCP to address 
multicultural awareness in Cooke 
County; The Law Enforcement 
Committee whose efforts are 
focused on the assimilation of data 
in regard to drug arrests which is ' 
made available to all law 
enforcement agencies within the tri-
county area; and the Youth 
Committee which reviews youth 
services within the tri-county area 
Review of existing programs and 
input of this information in the 
Electronic Bulletin Board are 
examples of current committee 
projects. 
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A Democrat and a Republican are 
sponsoring in the Texas Senate 
State Rep. Charles Fumell's bill to 
establish a way by which public 
schools may pay for 2-way 
television in order to share 
mounts and classes. 

The measure, House Bill 1029, 
was approved by the House April 7. 
House approval, Fmnell said, then 
placed Texas on "the threshold of 
21st Century educational 
technology." It requires no new tax 
dollars. RB 1029 already has been 
referred to the Senate Education 
Committee. 

"I am proud State Senators John 
Montford of Lubbock and Bill 
Ratliff of Mount Pleasant are 
carrying this bill in the Senate," said 

Finnell. "Only Senate approval and 
the governor's signature remain for 
this to become reality." 

Ratliff is a Republican; Montford, 
a Democrat 

"This is ample evidence this issue 
truly is non-partisan," Fumell said. 
"There can be no political 
partisanship when it comes to the 
education of Texas children." 

Eswell's bill provides a program 
to attract private and public grants, 
donations and gifts to finance fiber 
optics video systems allowing a 
teacher in one school to teach and 
respond to students in classrooms 
hundreds of miles from the teacher 
School districts would apply to the 
state for the 2-way television 
dollars. 

Ibis is what they decided: Elia—
The vision of the Texoma 
Community Partnership is to have 
safe and healthy individuals, 
families, and communities. MitilfMT 
-- The mission of the Teraina 
Community Partnership is to 
encourage all the people of Cooke, 
Fannin and Grayson Counties to 
work together to prevent alcohol, 
other drugs, and related issues from 
destroying ourselves, families, 
friends, and, communities. 
Strategiet  -- The TCP encourages 
the following Alcohol and Other 
Drug Abuse (AOSA) prevention 
strategies: *providing information 
'creating alternatives *developing 

Lindsay ISD elects officers 

to sitting around at one table and 
networking and talking with each 
other," commented Vicki "They 
didn't use the resources that were 
available. People were reinventing 
the wheel. I was at a committee 
meeting for example and somebody 
said, I really want to do parent 
training and I'm not looking forward 
to writing some curriculum.' The 
county extension agent said, T have 
that, all you have to do is come get 
it' Other people didn't realize that 
services already existed. The 
biggest impact I think so far is 
getting professionals to network and 
use each other and what is already 
existing." 
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by Elaine Schad 
LINDSAY—Joe O'Dell is the new 

president of the Lindsay school 
board following election of officers 
this week. 

Andy Berner was elected vice 
president and Carol Fuhrmann will 
be secretary. 

The board canvassed the votes 
from the May 3 school board 
election in which three school board 
members were elected. Susan 
Metzler bad 230 votes, Andy 
Bezner had 189 votes and Earl 
Cunningham had 189 votes to 
secure a place on the school board 
for three-year terms. Also running 

Lindsay City Council members sworn in 

for the positions were Michael 
Bengfort, who received 158 votes 
and Skipper Berner who received 
110 votes. 

Board members beard a report 
from the city on the drainage 
problems near the new parish hall. 
The city will install a gun barrel to 
alleviate any future drainage 
problems. 

In other matters, Teacher Troy 
Edes submitted a proposal to 
purchase about 30 computers for the 
school district's computer 
laboratories. The board discussed 
the position of athletic director, but 
took no action at the meeting. 

Cooke County receives 
OSHA safety award Henry assumes beat in Lindsay 

by Elaine Schad 
Lindsay's one-man police 

department has been officially 
resurrected as Jody Henry began his 
duties this week as the town's new 
police officer. 

Henry will work part-time as 
Lindsay's police officer in addition 
to his position as captain of the 
Gainesville Fire Department. Henry 
has experience in law enforcement 
which includes volunteer work as a 
reserve officer for the Cooke 

County Sheriffs Department. 
The city's one-man police 

department and the municipal court 
were abolished in June 1990, with 
officials citing economic concerns 
as the reason for its abolishment 
The Cooke County Sheriffs 
Department was asked to patrol the 
city in the absence of the police 
officer. The city council has been 
working for more than a year in 
upgrading department guidelines for 
operation. 

t 

1 

Cooke County Judge Ray Russell 
has announced that the County of 
Cooke bad received an 
Occupational Safety and Health 
Award from the Texas Safety 
Association (TSA) 	recognition 
of outstanding service and worthy 
accomplishments in accident 
prevention contributing to a safer 
Texas in 1992." Judge Russell 
stated that the award is awarded 
annually by the TSA to recognize 
those federal, state, county and 
municipal organizations with a 
significant reduction in employee 
occupational lost workday illnesses 
and injuries. Reduction in lost 
workdays must be at least 10% to 
qualify as a nominee for the Award 
of Mait. Cooke County had a 35% 
reduction for calendar year 1992/ 

The county bas been an active 
member of TSA since early 1991. 
TSA is a not-for-profit educational 
association, chartered in 1938 with 
2.861 member organizations which 
include private businesses ranging 
from huge multi-national 
corporations to small mom-and-pop 
operations, public sector agencies 

new Centennial Center and football 
stadium. City representatives met 
with the Lindsay school board 
during their May meeting. The 
school will pay to install a gun 
barrel for drainage on the west end 
of the stadium with the 
commissioner precinct assisting 
with installation and upgrading 
ditrhes The city will be installing a 
cable on the north side of the 
stadium parking lot to accommodate 
a more consistent traffic flow when 
games are being played. 

In a related matter, the city will 
install No Parking signs by 
sometime this summer along Fourth 
Street running along the Centennial ,„_ 
Center and the stadium. There will 
be no parking on either side of the 
street to allow for better traffic _ 
access. The city attorney is drawing s. 
up the ordinance, Walterscheid said. 

as did John Sandmann, who 
received 129 votes and Pat Bowman 
who received 107 votes. Other 
people running but who failed to get 
enough votes to secure a place on 
the council were Matt Bezner, who 
received 63 votes, and Richard 
Alfrey who had 57 votes. 

After taking their places, the new 
council acted on several items of 
business. They approved a proposal 
from Hawkins and Associates 
Engineers to perform an evaluation 
of the city's water system at a cost 
of $2,500. The engineering firm will 
make recommendations to the 
council about bow to upgrade its 
system, maintain proper water 
pressure and planning for future 
growth of the city, Walterscheid 
said. 

The council heard an update on 
drainage and parking concerning the 

was appointed to the position last 
year after Gene Hermes resigned, 
was running unopposed. The 
council appointed Danny Zwinggi 
as mayor protein. 

Three aldermen were seated for 
two-year terms after winning in 
Saturday's election. Andy Arendt 
received 135 votes to garner a seat 

by Elaine Schad 
Four people took the oath of 

office as new town aldermen for the 
City of Lindsay during the town's 
regular May meeting this week at 
Town Hall. 

Robert Walterscheid will serve as 
mayor for a two-year term after he 
received 116 votes in Saturdays city 
council election. Watterscheid, who 

Mark your calendar NOW! 

Cooke County Chorale 
presents 

John Rutter's "Requiem" 
Sunday, May 23 4:00 p.m. 

First Baptist Church, Gainesville 
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Tax Talk 
By: Duane Knabe, CPA 

Duane Knabe will discuss • 
different topic each week. Any 
questions should be directed to 
him at 759-4010. 

This week's topic is estimated 
tax payments (ES payments). The 
purpose of ES payments is to 
provide for current payment of 
incase taxes not collected 
through withholding. 

The general rule for taxpayers 
who have less then 6100,000 in 
intone is that they pay 90% of 
the current year's tax or 100X of 
the prior year's tax to avoid the 
penalty for failure to pay 
estimated tax. However, no 
penalty will apply if the tax 
liability is less than $500. 

For estimated tax purposes, 
the year is broken down into four 
payment periods. A calendar-year 
individual's four installments 
are due the 15th of April, Are, 
September and January. 

U.S. SAVINGS BONDS 
FOR EDUCATION 

For current rates, call 
1-800-4uS BOND 
1-800-487-2663 
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Diamond and Kt. Gold Jewelry ALWAYS Sale Priced 	. erS 
Sete

N°  THE ORIGINA L  Jim  
Seeds 

anie,66S-0112.  

JelljelerS tir so„ 
Over  4B  Yeats 

''On the side of 
Grand Ave. 

with the Rockets" ann. 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 
County • 1 year $25.00; 2 years $45.00 
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Batteries 

Always Fresh 

Shop the Drive-In Window 
for all your prescriptions 

and drug needs. 

WATTS' 
PRESCRIPTION SHOP 
302N Grand 	Gainesville 

665-3438 	6 6-XE 

Muenster Memorial Hospital would like to thank 
the MMH Auxiliary for taking on the tremendous job 
of manning the admission gates during Germartfest 
This project is a major fund raiser for the Auxiliary 

and the proceeds will benefit the hospitaL 
The MMH Board and Staff would also like to thank 

the Auxiliary for hosting the "Get Acquainted Social" 
on Sunday, April 18. The large attendance of 

approximately 250 people at the Social shows that 
the community does care about our hospital. The 
Auxiliary's efforts on behalf of the Hospital are 

truly appreciated. 

MMH Muenster Memorial 
Hospital Board 

6444 

Medical 
Care You 
Can Trust 
In today's busy world, people are 
looking for quality health care 
close to home. 
For that reason, the Muenster 
Memorial Hospital Board selected 
Dr. Tompkins. His specialty is 
Internal Medicine. 
What is internal medicine? It 
involves the diagnosis and 
treatment of the internal organs such as heart, lungs, gastrointestinal 
tract, prostate, kidneys and thyroid. 
Dt Tompkins also evaluates and treats other conditions including 
allergies, diabetes, hypertension, cholesterol, anemia and arthritis. 
In addition, preventive medical care is available including well woman 
exams (pap smears), mammograms and annual physicals. 
For art appointment or more information, we invite you to call Dr. 
Tompkins' office: 

Red River Internal Medicine 
Jon S. Tompkins, D.O., 

F.A.C.O.I. 
Board Certified Internal Medicine 

531 North Maple, Muenstez, TX 76252 
(817) 7594298 

MMH 
MUENSTER 
MEMORIAL 
HOSPITAL 
605 North Maple 
P.O. Box 370 
Muenster, Texas 76252 
(817) 759-2271 

Dr. Jon Tompkins, D.O. 

Invest in Catholic Education 

Support the Sacred Heart School Trust Fund.  

A memorial gift will earn income for Catholic 

education in memory of the donor. 

An annuity gift will earn interest for the donor or designate 

for the rest of their life after which the gift will be used for Catholic 

Education. 

A donation to the Sacred Heart School Trust Fund is an 

investment in Catholic Education. 

Sacred Heart Parish 
714 North Main 	Muenster, Texas 76252 
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'nershi Ap April rebates increase for Muenster 

1 

percent from the prior year. Their 
total payments to date in '93 are 
$439,231.62, a change of 14.93 
percent more. 

Another city with a decrease this 
month is Lindsay with $3,213.29. It 
is down 16.71 percent from last 
April's rebate. With an April '93 
check for $2,629.73, Oak Ridge 
noted a decrease of 6.72 percent 
from a year ago. Lindsay's total 
payments to date, $15,287.01 and 
Oak Ridge's, $11,305.09, are up 
from a year ago by 3.45 percent and 
1.01 percent, respectively. 

Cooke County's April rebate was 
$44,315.19, a change of -5.33 from 
April '92. Total payments to date, 
$254,745.20, are still 13 percent 
better than a year ago. 

All totaled, Cooke County cities 
received $94,907.43 in April sales 
tax rebates. Muenster's and Valley 
View's checks for April were 
improvements from a year ago. All 
other Cooke County cities slipped. 

Muenster's April check was for 
$7,087.53, up 10.55 percent from 
the April '92 check of $6,411.26. 
To date in 1993, Muenster has 
received $39,475.47. This is also up 
from 1992 by 13.07 percent. 

Valley View received $1,714.43. 
This is an improvement of 30.90 
percent from '92s check of 
$1,309.70. To date, Valley View 
received $10,165.42, up 3.09 
percent from 1992. 

Gainesville's check was for 
$80.262.45, a decrease of 3.29 

State Comptroller John Sharp 
sent a total of $99 million in April 
sales tax rebates to 971 Texas cities 
and 109 counties, virtually 
unchanged from their payments of 
one year ago. 

Texas cities received $89.3 
' million, down 0.04 percent from 

A the $89.4 million they received last 
" ' April. Counties received a total of 

' $9.6 million for their April rebates, 
- dropping 2.43 percent from their 
' April 1992 payment of $9.9 

441. million. 
• "Despite the slight decrease in 
' sales tax allocations to Texas cities 

and counties in April, Texas has 
exhibited modest economic growth 
during the past 12 months. Most of 

, Texas' major cities showed modest 
' gains in employment," Sharp said. 

Mall opening set for Aug. 14 
2 Muenster businesses receive awards 

at Texas meat processors' convention 
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the competition. 
H & W Meat entered five items 

and won four ribbons. Their 
summer sausage took reserve grand 
champion. H & W's smoked 
sausage, breakfast sausage and 
smoked bacon were presented 
champion awards. Don Hess was H 
& W 's representative at the 
convention. They hold several 
awards from past conventions. 

from around the state took part in 
various categories of competition. 

Fischer's received Grand 
Champion plaques for their smoked 
turkey, smoked ring breakfast 
sausage, and summer sausage and a 
Champion award for commercial 
hams. John and Louise Fisher 
attended the convention and 
accepted the awards for Fisher's. 
This was Fischer's first time to enter 

Fischer's Meat Market and H & 
W Meat Co. of Muenster have won 
state-wide recognition for their tasty 
meat products. Representatives 
from the local meat companies 
attended the annual Texas 
Association of Meat Processors 
(T.A.M.P.) Convention in Tyler 
from April 16-18 and came home 
with several awards. 
Approximately 50 other processors 

DUININCK BROTHERS, INC. paving crew finished the Main Street repair project by laying 1,203 tons of hot 
mix asphalt in three days. The machine operator in this picture is Jerry Fincannon. The job superintendent is 
Michael Herigon. 	 Dave Fene Photo 

ABRAHAM ROSENTHAL, vice president of the Prime Group of 
Chicago, Illinois, points to a location on the site of the Gainesville Factory 
Shops as he explains construction progress. The walls of the retail mall are 
in the background. The mall will open Aug. 14 north of Gainesville. 

Elaine Schad Photo 

by Elaine Schad 
The $21 million Gainesville 

Factory Shops will open its doors to 
the public Aug. 14 and bring 300 
jobs to Cooke County, officials with 
the Prime Group of Chicago, Ill., 
offices have announced. 

Construction of • the 210,000 
square foot development has 
continued at a rapid pace since the 
Prime Group broke ground on Jan. 
20, said Abraham Rosenthal, 
executive vice president of the retail 
development group. The past three 
months have mainly been involved 
with underground work, including 
utilities, he said. "You'll see a 
tremendous amount of change in 
coming weeks," Rosenthal said. A 
second crane will begin work on 

, Monday to speed up construction of 
the outer walls, he said. About 150 
construction workers are employed 
at present, he said. 

The factory shops site will serve 
as a central interview point, where 
the Prime Group will begin hiring 
workers for the retail stores located 
inside the mall within 60 to 90 days 
of opening, Rosenthal said. The 

,group is also looking for a 
marketing director and a property, 

, development director to work with 
- the Gainesville project, he said. 

Rosenthal said about 90 percent 
of the shops in the mall have been 

- leased and the remaining are 
expected to be in place by Aug. 14. 
The group has already announced 
the go-ahead for phase two of the 
project, which will include an 
additional 150,000 square feet at a 
cost of about $11 million. Also part 
of the factory shops is a food court 
which will include eight food court 
tenants and seating for up to 200 
people. About $400,000 will be 
spent on landscaping. Officials said 

corporation established in 1985 to 
serve and protect the public by 
maintaining and enforcing high 
standards of ethical professional 
conduct among Certified .Financial 
Planner licensees. An independent 
certifying organization, the IBCFP 
owns the marks "CFP" and 
"Certified Financial Planner," the 
most widely-recognized marks in 
the financial planning profession. 
More than 23,000 financial planners 
are presently licensed to use these 
marks. 

Wallace Inglish, CFP, has been 
authorized by the International 
Board of Standards and Practices 
for Certified Financial Planters, 
Inc. (IBCFP) to use the marks 
"CFP" and "Certified Financial 
Planner" in accordance with the 
IBCFP Code of Ethics and 
Standards of Practice and 
Disciplinary Procedures. 

These marks identify those 
individuals who have met the 
rigorous experience and ethical 
requirements of the IBCFP, have 
successfully complete coursework 
at an IBCFP-registered institution 
and have passed the certification 
examinations in the following areas: 
the financial planning process, risk 
management, investments, tax 
planning and management, 
retirement and employee benefits, 
and estate planning. 

The IBCFP is a non-profit 

ors sworn in 

• 

Inglish earns Certified 
Financial Planner status 

art, Prescription Shop 

a grand opening fundraiser to 	The mall is similar to one which 
benefit an area charity will be held The Prime Group opened in San 
on the eve of the formal grand Marcos in August 1990, said Paul 
opening. 	 Reed, development director for the 

A huge concrete pillar featuring a Prime Group.- Rosenthal said the 
quarterhorse rearing up on its hind Gainesville project is the largest 
legs acts as a calling card for the phase one project initiated by the 
front of the upscale mall, which is group. While officials still decline 
being constructed with a motif to specify tenants, mall tenants will 
depicting the days of the Santa Fe be similar to those in San Marcos, 
Depot and located on 129 acres in which include Nike, Vanity Fair, 
the northern city limits of Corbin, Tourister Luggage and 
No. 499 along Farm-to Market Donna Karen Fashions of New 
Road 1202 about three miles south York, Prime Group officialnaid. 
of the Red River. 

Tax-advantaged investments attractive 
under Clinton's proposed tax package 

highlights investment strategies in 
light of the proposals. The firm also 
publishes a monthly stock report 
titled Equity Strategy that provides 
discussion and background on the 
current trends in the stock market 
Contact A.G. Edwards' Gainesville 
office for a free copy of each report. 

Gifts for Mom, Dad and Grad 
Bridal Sets $69.95 t Up 

Quartz Watches MIS 8 Up 

a While-U-Wait Services: 
1 	Ring Sizing 
1 Minor Jewelry IS Watch Repair 
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percent surtax on taxable incomes 
of both individuals and couples 
making more than $250,000, 
bringing the tax bracket for the 
wealthiest taxpayers to 39.6 percent 

"With a possible new upper tax 
bracket and a surtax on taxable 
income of more than $250,000, 
investors affected by these increases 
would be smart to look now at tax-
advantaged or tax-free 
investments," said Betty Peveto, 
Branch Manager of A.G. Edwards' 
Gainesville office. 

Even under the current tax 
structure, many middle-income 
investors have realized the 
advantages of investing in tax-
exempt municipal bonds. The 
Clinton proposals will make tax-
exempt investments even more 
attractive. The higher the income of 
the investor, the better tax-exempt 
municipal bonds and tax-deferred 
annuities will look. 

According to Peveto, municipal 
bonds have long been a vehicle that 
helps investors minimize their tax 
burdens. Interest produced by 
municipal bonds is free from federal 
income tax and, depending on your 
state of residence, possibly from 
state income tax, too. 

A.G. Edwards has published a 
special report titled Tax-Free 
Strategies in Light of the Clinton 
Tax Proposals. This report 
discusses the nit ton plan and 

If President Clinton's tax package 
emerges from Congress intact, it is 
clear that tax-advantaged 
investments and even stocks may 
look more attractive to investors 
seeking investment alternatives with 
lower tax burdens. 

Two of the more publicized tax 
increases in the Clinton plan include 
a new 36-percent bracket affecting 
individuals with taxable income 
exceeding $115,000 and couples 
with taxable income of more than 
$140,000. This is up from the 
current top rate of 31 percent. 

The second increase is a 10- 
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YOU CANT ALWAYS SEE IT COMING — 

BUT YOUR DOCTOR CAN 

DR, MARGIE A YORK, OPTOMETRIST 
Family Eye Care, Eye Disease Detection 
Contact Lenses, Low Vision, Eye Glasses 

large selection offrwnes at stock 
OFFICE HOURS: Mori10:00 - 6:00. 

Wed.9•00 - 5:00, Fri 9. 00 - 5:00 
for an appointment call 759-4700 

located near Muenster Memonal Hospital 

BLINDNESS:  
May is Sight Saving Month 
inn boaay ro Proverri !Winans 

WILLIAM J. VOGEL 

loAnna Cantreff 

Brad Senscheid 
Cooke County Appliance 

Muenster 	 Gainesville 

Colorful new outdoor 
Glasses, Pitchers, Trays, 

Ice Buckets for your 
patio 

• humor Design Scrocm 
• Custom Window 

Trestroma and Bed 
Covering. 

• Verticals. NOni-Blinds. 
Pleated Shades 

• Bridal Registry Bob and Virginia Archer Gift Wnp & Delivery 

map  1095outh Commerce 	WealSideof Squat offira 
665-5735 	 GainesvIlle.7nu 

5-744  

Special thanks to all who made 
the First Communion 

so memorable: 

To Father Victor who presided beautifully and for 
his homily. 

To Father Camillus who co-celebrated the Mau 
and WO/ a cup minister to the children and 

parents. 
To teachers, Sister Genevieve, Debbie Hartman, 

Linda Knob*, and Sandra Hennigan, for long hour. 
of preparing and practicing with the children. 

To the ?planar ministers, Christy Ilene, Ruth Felderhoff 
and Pam and Dave Fete. 

To Shirley Knabe who did calligraphy on the 
certificates a. well as name tags 

To the Ruchariptic ministers Kyla Henerheid, Dorothy 
Fisher, Cindy GA'S', Florence Growing, Regina Eels, and 

Peggy Walterscheid. 
To the servers John Bartush, Chad Felderhoff, 

Matthew Fuhrmann, Chrialopher Crewing and Bart 
.Sicking. 

To the parents for their cooperation and help. 
To Lora', for teacher corsages and boys boutonniere.. 

To Donna Siff!, who got containers and bird seed 
to put the candles in. 

To Loretta Felderhoff who typed the master copy of the 
Maas booklet. 

To Monica McCoy who run at least 3,000 copies of Maas 
booklet. 

To She Sacred Heart High School student who collated and 
stapled the Maw booklets. 

To Dolores Miller who helped staple the booklet,. 
To Miriam Caplinger, sacriatin, for the flowers and 

special preparation. 
To Roach Photography, for video taping the Ma•• 

and taking group and individual photos. 
To Danny Stoffels for putting up the ban nr rw. 

Barbara Fah rna a n 

WE'RE Chevrolet-Geo 
1993 Chevy Ext. Cab 

L-L-cali 
A 	i 

e Welcome All 
Credit Union 

Members 

Huge Supply 4x4 and 2WD 

Over 130 New Cars, '11-ucks In Stock 

1993 Chevrolet Cavalier 

*17912 

Per Month 

1457501 
• Om. Bowl Bug Mt RAC • MOM fat ohs,* Dawe Ph.TTeL 

as DS. r. IMaih 

Brown Motor Company, Inc. 
I aggbow•y 52 (017) now-Seal  

Mon.-Prl. a. Oo- ti•oft, R.a. R 00 6.00 
C.1onvi 1. 

IN LOW PRICES 
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Cook 3-ferme.s exchanges vows in St. Peter's ceremony April 17 Lifestyle 	 

4 

decorated with trailing English ivy, 
lighted candles and yellow roses, 
the bride was presented by her 
falba, Harold Ca 

For her wedding, she chose a 
white bridal satin gown with at 
elaborate baldheaded ruled bodice 
featuring a sweetheart neckline and 
long satin Elizabethan sleeves with 
pearl-trimmed lace. From the 
elongated waist, the full skin fell to 
slipper length in front, and flowed 
into a cathedral train. 

Her fingertip veil of illusion was 
sprinkled with pearls, and softly 
gathered to a crown of re-
embroidered lace and pearls. 

She carried a hand-tied bridal 
bouquet of yellow silk roses and 
rosebuds, yellow freesia, white 
stock, white pearls and green fern 
tied with a turquoise bow, entwined 
with a crystal rosary, a gift from the 
groan's grandmother. 

For tradition, she carried her 
great-grandmother's handkerchief, 
and wore a borrowed petticoat slip 
and a blue garter. 

ATTENDANTS 
Diane Martin, the bride's sister, 

was matron of honor. Bridesmaids 

The wedding of Susan Denise 
Cook and Douglas lot Hermes was 
held in St. Pealsphl 

 
Catholic Marc* 

of Lincliay 	A 	17 at 5 p.m. 
with Father Stephen &kart 
officiating for the traditional 
Nuptial Mass and double-ring 
ceremony. 

The bride is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. lead Wilson and Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Cook, all of 
Gainesville. She is a 1980 graduate 
of Gainesville High School aid a 
1991 graduate of the University of 
North Texas with a Business 
degree, and is a dental assistant 
employed in the office of Gerald M. 
Graham, DDS, in Muenster. 

The groom is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Alfred "Fritz" Hermes of 
Lindsay. He is a 1983 graduate of 
Lindsay High School and a 1984 

=fmWaco with a Mechanical 
of Texas State Technical 

Engineering degree. He is self-
employed and owner/operator of 
Hamer Backboe and Canning. 

Before an altar decorated with 
white potted Easter lilies wrapped in 
turquoise foil and tied with yellow 
bows. and near the communion rail 

4 
r  

Catholic Life Ins. sponsors 
essay contest promoting patriotism 

MRS. MRS. DOUGLAS JOE HERMES 
nee Susan Denise Cook ... 

4-H Emerald riders host ride 

DOLLE DEANI PAGEL and Paul Joseph 
Porter Ilan 

1993 for Mir meg My. Tbeit engagement and apps 

have km annanced by her parents 
Ridurd and Kay 

Paton of Me 
fiallIC-FOID BC iiiold 

and Kathy Frau 

weding oil be 
Irina Sacred lint Catholic Church, 

Gillespie 093, officathig at 3 
pm. Attendants will b 

nem Krisu Sonar of Muenster and Patricia Wilson 

Beth Cradord of lathed. 
The bride-flea is a 19901 

Tech Diva* and received 
amaswes degee from Te 

in Speed red Seating Sciences. Ste is 
employed io Od 

Isagpage Pathologist. Porter is a 19(17 madame 
of Tea: 

sid a BA in Accounting and isemployed in Odessa as 
al 

Ile NWT enestneent is bait middens mensciebilw. 

St. Peter's Parish hosts 

dinner/dance May 15 

funds gathered $50.00 more than 
the 1992 top fundraiser. who was 
Tam Boyd. 

Special thanks goes to Harold and 
Curdy Bowles for coordinating the 
worthwhile event and to all the 
people who donated pledge money. 

MMH to host 
hamburger cookout 
for hospital week 

presented traditional processional 
and recessional and vocals "A Time 
For Us," "Amazing Grace' and 
"How Great Thou Art' 

RECEPTION 
A reception followed in the new 

Centennial Hall in Lindsay, booed 
by parents of the couple, for 400 
guests. 

Diane Gibson of Irving and Tad 
Whitley of Muenster, friends of the 
bride. presided at the guest book. 

White hearth baskets of spring 
flowers decorated tables, with 
lighted candles in crystal holders. 
Double-heart ornaments wrapped in 
miniature lights with turquoise and 
yellow ribbons and pearls decorated 
the dance floor, wine fountain and 
cheese table. 

White Janice, a background of 
eucalyptus and ivy and white ribbon 
graced the area behind the bride's 
table. Tall floor pedestals held 
hearth baskets of spring flowers. 
The bride's table was covered with 
ivory Noce highlighted with swags of 
yellow and white tulle and 
handmade satin rosettes of 
turquoise, ivory and yellow. 

The wedding cake, made by 
Betty Rose Walterscheid, was 
decorated with ivory basket weave 
icing, fresh yellow roses, and was 
topped with an heirloom bridal 
couple. The groom's German sweet 
chocolate cake held a decorated oil 
pumpjack design. 

Amy Hoenig cut the groom's 
cake. Cake servers were Jennifer 
Lawler, bride's niece, and Kami 
Klement, Kelly Felderhoff, Lisa 
Felderhoff, Leab Hermes and 
Kimberly Hennes, all related to the 
g0001. 

Since return from a cruise to the 
Bahamas, the couple resides in 
Muenster. 

The rehearsal dinner was hosted 
by the groom's parents on April 15 
and served outdoors at the home to 
40 guests. 

were Cindy Walker, Kristi 
Schneider and Kerry Dangelmayr, 
all of Muenster and friends of the 
bride, and Connie Hermes of 
Gainesville, groom's sister. Jana 
Martin, niece of the bride, was train 
bearer. They were attired in House 
of Bianchi designer dresses of an 
off-the-shoulder, hour-glass style, in 
turquoise moire. Jana's dress was 
cut in m "A" line fashion. They all 
carried band-tied bouquets of 
yellow silk roses, yellow freesia, 
alstromeria and white stock, tied 
with yellow moire. 

Ashlie Martin, bride's niece, as 
flower girl was similarly dressed 
and carried a basket of daisies. 
Jonathan Reed, groom's cousin and 
godchild, carried a handmade ring 
pillow made by Mary Kay 
Trubenbach, groom's aunt. 

Kurt Hennes of Lindsay, groom's 
brother, was best man. Groomsmen 
were Floyd Haverkamp of 
Muenster, Jeff Parsons of Lindsay, 
Danny New of Lindsay, all friends 
of the groom, and Brian Hennes of 
Lindsay. groom's brother. 

Ushers were Greg Cook of 
McAllen, Alan Cook of Heahnon. 
Oklahoma, brothers of the bride, 
Darren Voth of Muenster and Chad 
Martin of Gainesville, friends of the 
groom. 

Mass servers were Darren 
Hennigan and Jeff Klement of 
Muenster. Participants in the 
wedding liturgy were Mr. and Mn. 
Carl Schilling, groom's 
grandparents, who carried Offertory 
gifts to the altar, Eucharistic 
ministers were Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Walterscheid, groom's 
uncle and aunt, and Mrs. John 
Hermes, groom's aunt. Lectors were 
Sherrie Garcia, Karen Bartlett and 
JoEll Hellman. 

Music ministers were Geri Bivin 
of Muenster, organist, Bill Bivin, 
guitarist, Mikki Jones of Gainesville 
and Wendell Black of Myra. They 

additional information, please call 
the Catholic Life Insurance 
Communications Department at 1-
800-262-CLIU. 

Contest winners will be 
announced at a special Flag Day 
celebration that Catholic Life 
Insurance is sponsoring June 13 at 

' its home office in San Antonio. 
The essay contest is sponsored by 

Catholic Life Insurance, the San 
Antonio Express-News, the San 
Antonio Greater Chamber of 
Commerce and EZ's Restaurants. 

Founded 92 years ago. Catholic 
Life Insurance has been rated 
A/excellent by insurance analyst 
A.M. Best company for 11 
consecutive years. The Texas-based 
fraternal has assets exceeding $180 
million and insurance in force of 
more than 51.2 billion, 

Catholic Life Insurance. the 
nation's 10th largest fraternal life 
insurer, is sponsoring an essay 
contest to promote the celebration 
of Flag Day and the preservation of 
the Pledge of Allegiance. The topic 
of the essay coolest is "What the 
Pledge of Allegiance Means to Ma" 

This contest is open to students in 
grades 9 through 12 plus individuals 
55 years of age and older. 
Participants will compete with 
individuals from throughout the 
state for prizes and include a $500 
U.S. Savings Bond for 1st place, a 
$250 U.S. Savings Bond for 2nd 
place, and a $100 U.S. Savings 
Bond for 3rd place. 

All essays must be 250-500 
words in length and must be typed 
or written double spaced on an 8-
1/2x11-inch piece of paper. Entries 
must be submitted to Catholic Life 
Insurance by May 15, 1993. To 
obtain an entry form or for 

Proceeds will II 
special elPenseS• 

Reservations m 
Andy Beater, 6 
Arendt, 665-41 
Fatemann,66S-B5  

For connenienc 
opt of town and 
Mass will be offer 
Peters Chard. 

Si Peer's Parish of Lindsay  will 
gram a special event as a auto 
io anus a special fund for ihe 
parish in Lindsay There will be a 
dime: and dance on May 15, 
beginning at 6 pa. Adniusion 
tickets at 515.00 pa person include 
dinner, barlitineacidasheaJcoffee,  
followed by a dance. Tatou' will 
play for dancing. 

Wedding Selections fo, 3   
JoAnna Cantrel 

& Brad Henschel 
The Craft Boutup 

Hudspeth honored 
at banquet 

John Hudspeth, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Daniel P. Hudspeth of Dallas 
and grandson of-Clara Walterscheid 
of Muenster, was honored at the 
GTE/Texas A & M Athletic 
Academic Award Banquet with a 
plaque on Monday. April 12, for his 
accomplishments in swimming and 
maintaining a 3.0 grade point 
average. 

He is a junior at Texas A&M 
studying Civil Engineering. 

During the week of May 9-15 
hospitals across Texas and the 
United States will be celebrating 
Hospital Week. Gov. Ann Richards 
designated that Texas Hospital 
Week should coincide with the 
national week of celebration. 

Muenster Memorial Hospital will 
observe the occasion by sponsoring 
a hamburger cookout on 
Wednesday for staff, board 
members, clinic personnel and 
special guests. It will be held 
outside if the weather permits. Also 
food will be prepared for the 
hospital's evening shift. 

The 2nd Annual St. Jude's Saddle 
Up Trail Ride, hosted by the 4-I-I 
Emerald Riders, was a huge 
success. despite the persistent, 
intermatent and COLD rain. Forty-
seven hones and riders met at the 
Roston Fue Station and rode on the 
din road towards Leo. Because of 
the weather, they rode five miles 
out, that returned, for a total of 10 
miles instead of riding the 10 miles 
to Leo. 

Following this procedure, the 
riders were able to cal Weir lunch 
and bold their meeting in the 
relative warmth of the Fire Station. 
A total of 51,46345 was raised with 
the ride. The lop recruiter of funds 
was Lisa VanDever of DCM011, who 
raised $313.00 for St Jude's 
Hospital. Lisa received an emerald 
green beadsuill and reins set from 
the dub for her efforts. 

The hospital donated T-shirts, 
sports bags, sweatshirts and ribbons. 
all depending on the amount of 
money each participant raised, that 
could he worked towards. 

All of last year's records were 
broken. There were 11 more horses 
and riders this year, $1 10.00 more 
was raised, and the top recruiter of 213 N. Main, OW Theatre Mad, Muenster, 759 

Ton • Fri. 10:00 umWS:00pm 	Sal. 10:00 am 

• SH Parish prepares 
for Vacation 
Bible School 

Sacred Heart Parish will be 
having Vacation Bible School June 
14-18. The classes are held from 9 
to 11:30 am. for children ages 4-10. 
The theme of our parish VBS will 
be "We Catholics: Thy Kingdom 
Come." 

To ensure that this year's program 
will be a meaningful experience for 
the children Involved, we need your 
help. Persons are needed to teach 
and serve on committees such as 
nursery and refreshments. If you are 
able to help in any way, contact 
Mary Endres at 759-4810 or 
Ramona Felderhoff at 759-2878, 
ibis year's VBS program directors. 

The Muenster Hospit 
Auxiliary wishes to th( 

all the area volunteers 
gave their time to help a 

German  fest gates. 
You being there was a bid 

of our successful weehe 

Muenster Mc 
Hospital ALL 

UNDERWOOD'S 
L 3  ackeps (Li&  

Create oko  
viltil#earts 

William Vogel 
celebrates 3rd 

William John Vogel was three 
years old on Monday, April 26. He 
celebrated with a party at his home, 
hosted by his parents, Eve and 
Wilbert Vogel, in Muenster. 

Helping William celebrate his 
birthday were all his classmates of 
the Tender Loving Care Day Care 
Center. 

Special guests attending were 
grandmother, Mrs. Joe Vogel; great-
aunt, Miss Lu Vogel, who made the 
birthday cake. Nancy Paynter and 
Tracy Henscheid also helped with 
the party. 

Unable to attend but sending 
birthday greetings were maternal 
grandparents, Nanny and Pop 
Staley; Uncle Bill, Aunt Marion and 
cousins Adam and Elliot Staley, all 
of England. 
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Lindsay sweeps regional, 
wins championship 

Hellinger 6th individually. 
Lindsay's Spelling team also earned 
1st place and took home all the 
medals. Suzanna Hellinger and 
Janine Sorrenson tied for 1st and 
Tisha Wang came in 3rd. 

The Literary Criticism team of 
Janelle Fuhrmann, Christi Secrest 
and Stephany Pearson also won 1st 
place. Fuhrmann settled for a silver 
medal after tying for 1st and Secrest 
ended in 4th after a 3rd-place tie. 

Greg Arendt took home a bronze 
medal in Current Events. Arendt, 
along with Schmidlkofer and 
Matthew Murrell, finished 2nd as a 
team. 

Tanner Neidhardt was a double 
winner, a gold in Feature Writing 
and a 3rd place in News Writing. 
Suzanna Hellinger got the bronze in 
Ready Writing. 

In the Speaking Events, Leslie 
Cler won Persuasive Speaking and 
Allison Walterscheid finished 4th in 
Informative Speaking. Debaters 
Leslie Cler and Allison 
Walterscheid finished 3rd and 4th. 

Advancing to state competition 
are Suzanna Hellinger, Janine 
Sorrenson, Tisha Wang, Janelle 
Fuhrmann, Christi Secrest, 
Stephany Pearson, Leslie Cler, 
Darren Hundt, Doug Hellinger, 
Michael Schmidlkofer, Tanner 
Neidhardt and Greg Arendt. 

Tisha Wang's name was left out 
of last week's picture of state 
qualifiers. 

The UIL State Academic Meet 
will be held May 7 and 8 on the 
campus of the University of Texas 
at Austin. 

• 

Nil• Nale,„-2...--•Oac  il kispijyr  

Lindsay High School earned 235 
points at the UIL Regional Literary 
Meet last weekend at Abilene. 
Menard High School finished 2nd 
with 95, with Westbrook following 
with 75 points. 

In Science competition, the team 
of Doug Hellinger, Darren Hundt 
and Michael Schmidlkofer finished 
1st, taking home the medals -
Hellinger 1st, Hundt 2nd and 
Schmidlkofer 3rd. Hellinger also 
finished on top in the Biology, 
Chemistry and Physics categories. 

Darren Hundt took the gold in 
Math, with the Lindsay team of 
Hundt, Schmidlkofer and Tisha 
Wang coming in 1st place. 

Hellinger, Hundt and Wang 
finished 1st as a team in Number 
Sense, but Hundt came in 3rd and 
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DR. MARGIE A. YORK, OPTOMETRIST 
Fundy Eye Care, Eye Disease Detection 
Contact Lenses, Low Vision, Eye Glasses 

large selection limes in stock 
OFFICE HOURS: lion.10:00 - 6:00. 

Wed.9:00 • 5:00, Fri.9:00 - 5:00 
for an appointment call 7594700 
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The Forestburg ISD will ho d a 
kindergarten registration for the 
1993-94 school term on 
Wednesday, May 12, 1993 at 9 a.m. 
All kindergarten students must be 
five years of age before Sept. 1, 
1993. You must have a birth 
certificate and shot records. 

Kindergarten registration for 
children attending the Valley View 
school district for 1993-1994 will be 
held at 2 p.m. Tuesday, May 11, in 
the school library. Parents are asked 
to bring their child's complete 
immunization record, birth 
certificate and social security 
number. For more information, call 
the school at 726-3522. 

Be sure to mark your calendars 
for the annual Pre-Father's Day 
Picnic, sponsored by the Sacred 
Heart Parish, on June 13 in the 
Community Center. 

Highlights will be a bountiful 
noon dinner, silent auction all 
afternoon long, live auction in the 
evening, arts and crafts booth, 
raffle, cake walk, children's games 
and many other attractive booths. 

Sponsors urge everyone to hold 
their family reunion dinners in the 
Community Center. The red carpet 
will be rolled out, say the sponsors. 
Everyone is welcome. 

A spring band concert will be 
presented by Muenster High School 
and Seventh Grade Bands on 
Friday, May 14 at 2 p.m. in the high 
school auditorium. Everyone is 
welcome to attend. 

AARP will hold its covered dish 
luncheon at Stanford House on May 
7 at 11:30 a.m. 

JO ANNA CANTRELL of Saint Jo and Brad Henscheid of Muenster 
will be married on June 5, 1993. Their engagement and approaching 
marriage have been announced by her parents, Travis and Pat Cantrell of 
Saint Jo. Parents of the future-groom are Ted and Carol Henscheid of 
Muenster. The wedding will be held in Sacred Heart Church, with Father 
Victor Gillespie, OSB, officiating at 5 p.m. Attendants will be Amanda 
Cantrell, Charlotte Fuhrmann, Patty Miller, Amy Popp, Kathy Henscheid; 
and Curtis Henscheid, John Hartman, Darrel Swirczynski, Frank Popp and 
Ed Hess. The bride-elect is a 1989 graduate of Saint Jo High School and 
currently attends the Nursing program at Cooke County College where she 
's also employed as a secretary. She plans to graduate in December 1993 
as an RN. with a Associate Degree in Nursing. The future-groom is a 
984 graduate of Sacred Heart High School and a 1986 graduate of TSTI 

in Waco. He is employed at Weber Aircraft in Gainesville. 

DOLLE DEANN PAGEL and Paul Joseph Porter have chosen June 26, 
1993 for their wedding day. Their engagement and approaching marriage 
have been announced by her parents, Richard and Kay Pagel of Muenster. 
Parents of the future-groom are Harold and Kathy Frantum of Odessa. The 
wedding will be held in Sacred Heart Catholic Church, with Father Victor 
Gillespie, OSB, officiating at 3 p.m. Attendants will be the bride-elect's 
sister, Kristi Schneider of Muenster and Patricia Wilson of Carrollton and 
Beth Crawford of Lubbock. The bride-elect is a 1990 graduate of Texas 
Tech University and received a Master's degree from Texas Tech in 1992 
in Speech and Hearing Sciences. She is employed in Odessa as a Speech-
Language Pathologist. Porter is a 1992 graduate of Texas Tech University 
with a BA in Accounting and is employed in Odessa as an Accountant 

The above engagement is being reprinted due to an error in lad week's publication. spo  Special-  Gifts 
for Mom St. Peter's Parish hosts 

dinner/dance May 15 Let us help you with that just rights  gift 

for Mom this Mother's Day 
	 We offer FREE Gift Wrap Proceeds will benefit a fund for 

special expenses. 
Reservations may be phoned to 

Andy Bezner, 665-3884, David 
Arendt, 665-4760, or Linus 
Fuhrmann, 668-8592. 

For convenience of visitors from 
out of town and parishioners, a 
Mass will be offered at 5 p.m. in St. 
Peter's Church. 

• r•I 

	 The 	  

Y. ((Crafty Malt Orman P. 

St. Peter's Parish of Lindsay will 
present a special event as a project 
to create a special fund for the 
parish in Lindsay. There will be a 
dinner and dance on May 15, 
beginning at 6 p.m. Admission 
tickets at $15.00 per person include 
dinner, beer/wine/sodas/tea/coffee, 
followed by a dance. "Dakota" will 
play for dancing. 

a unique crafters showplace 2S anytime gift shoppe 
I= 216 N. Main, Muenster, 759-2505 gal 

11.1  
located new Muenster MonenslHospial • TIFFANY FISHER, daughter of 

Rita Fisher, won first place at the 
Garden Club State Convention in 
Houston on April 28 on a speech 
she wrote, "Gardening For a New 
Generation." Earlier, she presented 
the speech for the Muenster Garden 
Club, winning first place, advancing 
to district competition in Fort Worth 
and again winning first. Her prizes 
totaled $220.00, plus the expense- , 
paid trip to Houston. If Tiffany's 
speech places at the next level, she 
will compete in Asheville, North 
Carolina in the national level. 

Buy 1- Get 1 FREE Wedding Selections for 
JoAnna Cantrell 

& Brad Henscheid All Trees, 
Shrubs and 

The Craft Boutique 
m 213 N. Main, Old Theatre Mall, Muenster, 759-2563 

Tues. - Fri. 10:00 a.m. to 5:00 pm. 	 Sat. 10:00 a.m. to 0:00 pm. 

Due to several conflicts the 
Sacred Heart Talent Show had been 
rescheduled to Friday, June 4. The 
location has been changed to the 
Sacred Heart Football Field. The 
entertainment begins at 7 p.m., but 
they will open at 6:30 pan. to serve 
hamburgers. 

The Class of 1988 of Muenster 
High School will get together 
Sunday, May 16, at 1 p.m. at Kevin 
and Darla Anderle's home, 703 N. 
Elm, to plan the 5-year class 
reunion. Call 759-4070 for more 
information or to give ideas if 
unable to attend. 

ul new outdoor 
!s, Pitchers, Trays, 
:kets for your 

patio 

Bedding 
Plants 

Schedule 
of Meetings The Muenster Hospital 

Auxiliary wishes to thank 
all the area volunteers who 

gave their time to help at the 
Germanfest gates. 

You being there was a big part 
of our successful weekend! 

Muenster Memorial 
Hospital Auxiliary 

Roses Not Included , 

The VFW Ladies Auxiliary 
#6205 announces a change of date 
for the Installation meeting. The 
Ladies Auxiliary will meet on May 
10 at 8 p.m. They will each bring a 
covered salad or vegetable dish. 

The Muenster 4-H Club will meet 
Tuesday, May 11, 7 p.m. in the 
Sacred Heart High School. Election 
of officers will be held and plans for 
the summer will be discussed. 

An inquiry class will begin at 
Sacred Heart Church on Tuesday 
May 11, for anyone interested m 
joining the Catholic Church. It will 
meet from 5:30 to 6:30 p.m. in the 
Sacred Heart High School Library. 
If interested, call Barbara 
Fuhrmann, Director of Religious 
Education, 759-2511, Ext. 37 during 
the day or 759-4922 evenings. 

Muenster 
Garden Center 

A family reunion celebration will 
be held by descendants of Frank and 
Mary Hess on Sunday, June 27, at 
the Pavilion of Muenster City Park. 
Please bring food for the noon meal, 
and extra lawn chairs. A 

502 North Main, Muenster, Texas, 759-2766 
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Black 
Dustin Black welcomed a new 

baby sister, Carlee De'Nell Black, 
home this week. The proud parents 
are Wendell and Deeann Black of 
Myra. Carlee was born at 10:31 am. 
on Monday, May 3, 1993, at 
Gainesville Memorial Hospital. She 
weighed 6 lbs. 14 1/2 oz and 
measured 20 inches in length. 
Grandparents are Dorothy Black of 
Myra and the late David Black and 
Winston and Nell Roach of 
Rosston. Carlee was named after 
her paternal grandmother Dorothy 
Black, her maternal grandmother 
Nell Roach, the late Audilee 
Lovette, and her mother Deeann. 
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tarnily  Night 

very  Thursday 

0 off 411Y 
Dinner 

hare 99°  
Two MISD 

teachers honored 

Loyalty Day - May 1 
The Ladies Auxiliary to VFW 

#6205 celebrated Loyalty Day by 
making presentations of patriotic 
rulers to 1st and 12th grade students 
at Sacred Heart School and the two 
first grades at Muenster Public 
School. The students were also 
presented leaflets which explained 
why we celebrate Loyalty Day. 

It reads in part, "Loyalty Day has 
become a traditional celebration for 
the Veterans of Foreign Wars with 
the passage of Public Law 85-529 
on July 18, 1958. The VFW won a 
long, hard battle to have Loyalty 
Day approved by Congress. 
However, this day does not belong 
to the VFW alone, it belongs to all 
Americans. A day that is set aside to 
display and express our loyalty to 
these United States of America and 
all the freedoms we have as its 
citizens." 

The presentations were made by 
the Auxiliary chairmen, Sacred 
Heart senior Mandy Barnhill and 
Auxiliary President Frances Bayer. 

Another Loyalty Day program for 
the Auxiliary is the participation in 
the procession for the crowning of 
the Blessed Mother, Queen of May. 
The members carry American flags 
giving honor to Mary, the Patroness 
of the United State* of Amerim 

*ckailver 
tiNt 11W Lee 
If you love 

Jewelry, you'll 
love our Morel 

Chicken 
Scratch 
SPECIAL 

On Thursday, April 29, Robert 
McDaniel and Nancy Perryman, 
teachers at Muenster Public School, 
were presented with fruit baskets by 
the VFW Ladies Auxiliary #6205, 
as a token of appreciation for the 
many years they have given as 
caring teachers. 

The Auxiliary, each year, selects 
a teacher or teachers from each 
school to give a special recognition. 
The teachers at Sacred Heart were 
honored earlier in the year. They 
were Jo Bedowitz and the 
Benedictine Sisters. 

4 Golden Brown Chicken Strips, 
• French Fries, Country Gravy and 

Texas Toast. 

OPEN: Monday-Friday 
9:30 - 5:30 

Saturday 9:30 - 5:00 
103 E. California 

665-4223 . 

Popular 
Demand!Lai=  

Back by Owned by 

Barbara & Wallace Inglish 

LoOgaseitmusseua,  oijasiorre1/2mwe 



DIANNE PAGE/. 

r . 
Tanning Specials 

10 Tans for 

$2000  
1 Month 

Unlimited Tanning 

$3995 

- 	For more information call 
\i,044 ‘ 759-2548 

Muenster School of Dance 
220 N. Main 	Muenster, Texas 

LOOK 
1992 

813,495 

A16381 

Lumina APV 
Vb loaded • Lke Nei 

1992 
Lie New 

810,995 

P39491 

Caprice 
• Wel Equpped 

A47441 

1988 Ford 4x4 314 
Goo] Sdd Truck 

88,350 
Ton 

P05818 

1992 Geo Prizm 
Arlo • Au . Stereo 

86,995 
P18399 P81161 P30878 P56755 

1992 Olds Cutlass Cierra 1992 Pontiac Grand Am 1992 Beauville 1992 Pontiac Sunbird 
2 Does • Loaded • Etta Clean 4 Nu • Steep Bidet Seals. Ts • Cnise One Ton 'Passenger Van. Loaded Auto • lur• Slew 

59,995 810,495 815,995 88,895 
P82768 P81161 P30878 PA4785 

1992 Lumina Euro 1992 Pontiac Grand Am 1991 Lumina 1985 Silverado  Suburban 
20cas loaded . Ewa Clean 4Dacy Stereo ludel Stan. lit .Carm 4 Door . Good Equipment FA loaded 

811,995 I 1  0 495 88,995 85,595 
830821 P45938 P93906 PA0570 

1987 Buick Skyhawk 1992 Lumina Euro 1992 Lumina Coupe 1990 Cavalier 
4 Door' Edra Clean 4 DOOf , Loaded • BO Pal Good Eurpment One Owner 

83,995 810,995 89,495 85,495 
A38360 P29833 A56120 P91ao9 

1988 Suburban Silverado 1992 Pontiac Transport Van 1991 Chevrolet Pickup 1992 Beretta 
Fully Loaded Good Empmest Cheyenne Equpmen1 . S Speed . VI Low idles- Gad Equipment 

89r  995 815 1 995 89,495 89,495 

1992 Corsica $7 895  
P59593 

GM Program Car, Air, Automatic, Stereo, 
4 Door, V-6, ABS & More! 	 * Plus T, T&L 

120 Cars & Trucks In Stock 5-131SE 

OPEN ALL DAY 

SARIRDAY 

HAI 
Nana •••• 1=61 

a 	 //aa •••• ••••• WRNS UMO 

nvtIwnI 
Highway 82 CHEVROLET 98°1.73:: 

Whitesboro, TX 
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Pagel and Hess are 
honored by soroptimists 

JoYee  assist' 

Photography exhibit at Museum 

MICHELLE KERRIGAN and AMY 0170 
KRYSTAL HALE and TERRI SUE WIMIVIER 

Two seniors of Muenster High 
School, Dianne Pagel and Marlene 
Hess, were named Soroptinttst Girls 
of the Month for April, and were 
guests at the noon luncheon of the 
women's service organization in 
Gainesville, Both seniors are leaders 
in school, community activities, 
church affiliation and volunteer 
service projects and have pan-time 

J 
obs. 

Dianne Pagel is the daughter of 
John and JoAnn Pagel, co-owner of 
Community Lumber and a teacher 
in Muenster MD. Marlene Hess is 
the daughter of Mary Ann and Earl 
Hess; her mother is a Registered 
Nurse at Muenster Memorial 
Hospital and her father is self-
employed. Marlene has a twin sister 
and a brother and another sister. 

Her school credits include; 
Student Council Representative, examining the various 

developments in the art form from 
daguerreotypes and tintypes to the 
photographs that we all are familiar 
with wday. It also showcases the 
work of several photographers who 
once worked in this area and 
recorded the changing landscape of 
Cooke County's history. The exhibit 
will remain on display through 
May. For more information, please 
call the Morton Museum at 668-
8900. 

Images frozen in time - babies in 
wicker prams, men in frock coats, 
the first women to sit on a jury in 
Cooke County, and Camp Howze 
being built. Those sights and others 
were made possible by the creation 
or photography. 

The Cooke County Heritage 
Society is happy to announce the 
opening of a new exhibit at the 
Morton Museum of Cooke County. 
Entitled "Flash," the exhibit delves 
into the world of the photographer 

Muenster ISD announces Kiwanis 
students of the Month - March, April Lifeguard training class set 

A Lifeguard Training Class will 
begin at Muenster City Swim Pool 
on May 17 at 7 p.m. Persons 
wishing to enroll muse be at least 
15 years of age; swim 500 yards 
continuously, using the crawl, 
breaststroke, elementary backstroke 
and sidestroke; surface dive to 9 
feet and bring a 10-lb. weight to the 
surface; surface dive to 5 feet and 
swim 15 yards underwater, tread 
water 15 minutes. 

A fee of $75.00 will include text 
books, CPR and 'First Aid classes. 
Each participant should bring a 

TRAVIS and KARISSA 
REITER 

notebook, pen/pencil, swimsuit and 
towels. Course length will be 
approximately 30 hours. Upon 
successful completion of a final 
skills test, a written examination 
will require a passing grade of 80% 
or better for certification. 

The Lifeguard Certificate and 
First Aid Certificate are valid for 
three years. CPR Certification is 
valid for one year. 

For more information or 
clarification, call Jeannine Flusche,A., 
759-4497. 

Travis and 
Karissa 
cerebrate 
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spinach, conk 
milk. BREAKFA 

grades 9,10; Student Council 
Secretary; Student Council 
President, grade 12; Class Reporter, 
grades 9, 12; Class Secretary, grade 
11; National Honor Society; Band 
Award, grade 11; Cross Country 
Running, grades 9, 10, 11, 12; 
Track, grades 9, 10, 11; Basketball, 
9, 10; Persuasive Speaking 9; 
Editorial Writing 10, 11, 12; One-
Act Play 10, 12; Debate 11, 12; 
Prose 11; Informative Speaking 10, 
11, 12; Ready Writing 12; Band 
Secretary 11; Band President 12; 
Drum Major 11, 12; District Site-
Based Management Committee 

• Member 11, 12; Drug-Free Schools 
Committee Member; Hugh O'Brian 
youth Leadership Ambassador 10; 
Delegate to the Texas North, Texas 
Summit on Teen Pregnancy 11; 
Solo and Ensemble Band 
participant; Cooke County Electric 
Co-op Essay/Speech Winner; All-
Year-Honor Roll 1991-93; 

Church activities include JAM 
(Jesus Alive in Muenster); Bible 
School instructor. 

She has a part-timejob at 
Rohmer's Restaurant and Tops & 
Teams and plans to work in 
Congressman Ralph Hall's office in 
Washington, D.C. for six weeks this 
summer; then attend Texas Tech 
University to major in Political 
Science and minor in Speech 
Communications, hoping someday 
to be in government work. 

••• 
Dianne Pagel has an older sister 

and two older brothers. Her school 
credits include being a Cheerleader 
in grades 9, 10, 11. 12 and Head 
Cheerleader 12; member of the 
National Honor Society in grades 
11, 12; a member of the Student 
Council in 11, 12; Varsity Track 
member 9, 10, 11, 12; Varsity 
Basketball player 9, 10, 11, 12; 
Varsity Basketball Co-captain in 
grade 12; member of Future 
Homemakers of America in 9, 10, 
11, 12; Parliamentarian FHA in 12; 
Band member in 9; UIL participant 
In Newswriting 10, 11, 12; UIL 
participant in Keyboarding 11 and 
12; Varsity Track 9, 10, 11, 12; 
Honorable Mention All-District 
Basketball 11 and 12; All-Year 
Honor Roll grades 11 and 12. 

Church activities include 
membership In JAM, for four years; 
Eucharistic Minister of Sacred 
Heart Parish for two years. 

Dianne is employed part-time at 
The Center Restaurant in Muenster. 
She will attend Cooke County 
College for one year and then plans 
to transfer to a major university. She 
has not decided on a major course 
of tudy. 
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Following the luncheon, the 

. 	Hoenig's volunteer service was 
conducted mainly at St. Richard's 
Villa, the Saint Jo Nursing Home 
manuer.  and atthe SNAP Center in 

He has contributed between 1,200 
and 1,300 miles in the conduct of 

P 

 

his assistance. Activities included 
visiting sick people; volunteer 
barber work for men; playing the 
piano to entertain every Friday at milk. 

	

the Saint Jo Nursing Center and 	Thur. - LI NN 
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Travis and Karissa Reiter, 
children of Lloyd and Mary Reiter, 
recently celebrated their birthdays. 
They are grandchildren of Wilfred 
and Polly Reiter of Muenster and 
Julius and Marcella Metzler of 
Lindsay. 

Travis turned six years old on 
April 4 and celebrated with a 
bowling party with his friends. They 

• enjoyed a Batman cake made and 
decorated by Travis' mother. 

Karissa enjoyed Travis' bowling 
party and decided she, too, wanted a 
bowling party when she celebrated 
her fourth birthday on April 15. Her 
cake was an Easter bunny cake 
made and decorated by her 
grandmother, Polly Reiter. 

On Easter Sunday, Travis and 
Karissa were surprised with a 
birthday party at the home of their 
grandparents, Wilfred and Polly 
Reiter. 

In attendance at the Easter 
celebration and birthday party 
afterwards were Travis' 'and 
Karissa's little brother, Austin; their 
parents; grandparents; and Uncle 
Roger Reiter. 

Also Paul and LeeAnn Kubis of 
Houston; Toby and Jaime Kubis of 
Florida; Don, Kim, Brian, David, 
Stephen and Christina Wiese of 
Gainesville; and Tim, Lynn, Brody 
and Tyler Gibson of Keller. 

Michelle Hannigan Is the 
Muenster High School student of 
the month for March. She is the 
daughter of Mike and Janie 
Hennipn and a senior. Michelle is 
active in several organizations. She 
was chosen for her effort as a 
student side In the offices of 

pal.  
the 

counselor and the princi 
Michelle has hel pful, postve 
attitude that has made things

i 
 run 

more smoothly this spring, 
especially with several staff 
members out for Illness. 

From the elementary school 
Krystal Hale was named March 
Student of the Month. She Is a third 
grade honor student in Ann,  Popp's 
class and the daughter of Kim and 
Debbie Hale, !Crystal Is always 
willing to help others. She has a 
great attitude toward learning and 
always works hard to do her best. 
She shares her cheerful smile and 
happy outlook with everyone, 
Spelling and Mathematics are her 
f
good
avorite

grades 
subjects because she makes 

and has fun 
them,

learning 
In her sp to rs time she likes  

play Sorry and card gates with her 
friends and family. She Is looking 
forward togoing to Sea World and 
the lake with her family. 

Amy Otto, the daughter of Ed and 

Darlene Otto, was chosen as April 
Student of the Month for Muenster 
High. She was nominated by the 
faculty for her work in the Gifted 
and Talented Class. Amy is a Junior 
and puts In long hours workin on 
various Gifted and Talented projects 
and programs for Muenster igh 
School specie/ activities, Her artistic 
ability and fine eye for detail help 
produce quality publications, such 
as the Muenster ISD Newsletter. 
The MHS staff greatly appreciates 
Amy's efforts. 

Terri Sue Wimmer, daughter of 
Terry and Cindy Wimmer, Is the 
April Student of the Month for 
Muenster elementary. She is a very 
capable fourth grade student in 
Theresa Waltersclwid's class. Terri 
Sue always does her best In every 
thing that she attempts, is always 
cheerful, cooperative and pays 
attention In class. Her favorite 
addict is social studies because she 
likes to, "Learn about what 
happened before she came along." 
Terri Sue also likes art class 
because she likes to draw people 
and animals. She spends some of 
her free time reading mystery 
books, riding her bike after school 
and playing with her dogs end cats. 

Stoffels and Schumacher, 
CPA 

have moved to 
1105 Olive Street, Gainesville 

668-8332 
43-30-341 
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'innumerable times, he visas, plays 
; the piano, helps with exercises, etc. 
: He is always on call and always 

within reach...  
Other volunteers recognized with 

medals or pint for Five-Year 
Awards included these from 
Muenster: Julia Cunningham, 
Florence Fisher, Dorothy M. 
Hartman, Veronica M. Hoagland, 
Joe Hoenig, Rose Hofbauer, Bertha 

SPiteeter ar, Mif VioletgeSni  Steizer,chi 	AgnesitCharlieA  
Walter, the late Oscar Walter, 
Susanna Wider, Al Wiesman, 

?i1C;arlifinliWinVigesmaninirilin ler9118Lfrelwvitereht Wjtholimilerienedlahic;  
Hess, Margaret 

Hermes, and Bonnie L. 
Mariaret Kupper and :c 	Williams. Irene Wimmer 

Lawrence Wimmer joined in 

8199.  Joining  in 1992 were R ppn....yet,erAIM;e111.Cler and Arnold H. 
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Arts 8, Crafts 
Mountain Men Encampment 

Entertainment 
Model Train Display 
Museums & Exhibits 

Buggy Rides 
Fun Run ' 8 Blke Rally 

Historic Homes Tour "" 
Country Caravan "" 

VFW ladies elect 
officers at meeting 

in April 
Electing officers for the coming 

term was the main topic of business 
at the April 19 meeting of the 
Ladies Auxiliary to the VFW Post 
6205. It was held in the post home. 

Officers elected are Dorothy 
Hesse, president; Mary Lee 
Hannigan, senior vice president; 
Josephine Schilling, junior vice 
president; Lucille Hesse, treasurer; 
Theresa Muller, secretary; Ethel 
Hesse, chaplain; ' Linda Knabe, 
conductress; Juanita Knabe, guard; 
Julie Cunningham, three year 
trustee; Agnes Hesse, two year 
trustee; Hilda Sicking, one year 
trustee. Appointive offices will be 
filled by the newly elected 
president. 

The April meeting was conducted 
by Frances Bayer, president. Janet 
Barnhill was Patriotic Instructor pro 
tem. Communications, roll call and 
the minutes of the previous meeting 
were read by Ida Bladed, secretary. 
Lucille Hesse gave the treasurer's 
report. 

It was reported that Frances 
Bayer and Ethel Hesse replaced 
several shrubs at the  Veteran s Plot 
in Sacred Heart Cemetery. Trustees 
reported that the books were in 
order. 

Loyalty Day and May Crowning 
were discussed. Members were 
asked to participate In the May 
Crowning service on May 5. It was 
decided to have a Mass offered for 
deceased veterans. 

District 1 meeting will be May 15 
and 16 in McKinney. 

Julie Cunningham served lunch 
to 16 members. 

The door prize was won by Sue 
Meier. Juanita Knabe will be the 
May hostess. 
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It Was News Then... 

t 

formerly of Lindsay, named "Man 
of the Year" in St. George's Parish 
in Fort Worth. Kuhn families attend 
special investiture of cousin, Msgr. 
A.W. Behrens, in Iowa, in papal 
honors. J.A. Sanders, 65, oil 
company superintendent on TCU 
Linn lease, dies of heart attack. 

50 YEARS AGO 
May 7,1943 

Muenster's War Bond Drive goes 
over the top. Quota is exceeded by 
$3,000. Golden wedding is 
observed by Mr. and Mrs. John 
Eberhart. New City Council 
includes Mayor J.M. Weinzapfel 
and Aldermen J.A. Fisher, Andy 
Hofbauer, Henry Stelzer, Nick 
Miller and LA. Schoech. J.A. Fisher 
named Mayor Pro-Tem. F.A. 
Kathman is appointed city 
secretary; Mrs. L.A. Bernauer 
treasurer; Mrs. Nick Miller tax 
assessor; Dr. T.S. Myrick city 
health officer; and J.P. Flusche city 
and fire marshall. 

Ashley Hartman attends HOBY Joe Hoenig gets top award 
Joe Hoenig was honored as the area in Cooke County. 

i 1993 Cooke County Volunteer of 	Door prizes were announced by 
the Year, in a program held on April Julia Cunningham and Loretta 

Wimmer, members of the RSVP 
Advisory Council; also members, 
Joyce Malinowsky and Elsie 
Lohner, assisted with the "Name 
That Tune" Contest. 

Special guests at the luncheon 
and program were member of the 
Retired Senior Volunteer Staff, 
officers of Tri-County Senior 
Nutrition, and Tri-County Senior 
Nutrition Board of Directors. DIANirgt, „ 

rACEL 

PhY exhibit at Museum LUNCH 
MENUS 

r  • 
ASHLEY HARTMAN 

Seminar has motivated me to 
become more active in my school 
and community. I not only met 
many interesting people, but I also 
met some lifelong friends. I 
especially want to thank the local 
Kiwanis Club for sponsoring me 
and making my HOBY experience 
possible," said Ashley. 
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examining 	the 	
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coats, developments in the an form from 
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James 
Boot & 

Shoe 
Repair 

10 YEARS AGO 
May 6,1983 

German Fun Run of Muenster 
Germanfest is now second biggest 
in the state. Big race had 4,179 paid 
entries. 1983 Germanfest goes 
smoothly. Chairman Alvin Fuhrman 
said attendance estimates place 
number about the same as 1982, 
between 50 to 55,000. Muenster 
Enterprise publishes special Soil 
Conservation section in FOCUS 
magazine segment. Glenn Hellman 
named Outstanding Conservation 
Farmer of Zone III. Banquet held in 
Whitesboro on May 5. Obit Albert 
J. Hess dies at age 71 after long 
illness; Maurice H. (Chili) King 
dies of cancer at age 74. Mrs. Marie 
Reiter wins "Yard of the Month" 
award from Muenster Garden Club. 
Senior rings are blessed in CCD 
during participation in the 
Wednesday night parish Mass. 
Tigerettes take 3rd and Tigers take 
4th in TCIL State Track Meet in 
Houston. Little League baseball will 
get underway next week. 

Buckle Up 
For Those 

Who Depend on You 

30 YEARS AGO 
May 3,1963 

Dial Telephone Service begins in 
Muenster area on Saturday, May 4, 
at 2 p.m. Wonderful rains totaling 
3.49 inches break drought. Jaycee 
chapter organizes in Muenster and 
Joe Galloway is elected president. 
First project is sponsorship of 1963 
Little League Baseball. Sixteen 
graduates and four sponsors will 
take class trip to Colorado by train. 
Excursion was arranged by Don 
Muller of Dallas. Sister Mildred 
Felderhoff is stationed full time at 
Muenster Memorial Hospital. New 
arrivals: James Gary to Mr. and 
Mrs. James Hess; a son for Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Swirczynski. Obit: 
Regina, 10-year-old daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Vernon, dies in 
Subiaco, Arkansas. Jerry Vernon is 
a former SHHS coach. Wedding: 
Jeanette Walterscheid and Johnny 
Reiter are married here. Mr. and 
Mrs. Pete Mosman celebrate golden 
wedding anniversary. Carl Beyer, 

Ashley Hartman, daughter of Roy 
and Irene Hartman, represented 
Muenster Public School at the Hugh 
O'Brian Youth Foundation's 
Leadership Seminar. The HOBY 
Seminar (the acronym by which it is 
best known) was held on April 16, 
17 and 18 at the Clarion Hotel in 
Dallas. 

The seminar is open to high 
school sophomores who have met 
the necessary qualifications and 
have been selected by the faculty of 
their schools. 

Because he believed that 
America's greatest resource is its 
youth, Hugh O'Brian, the actor who 
played Wyatt Earp in the popular 
television series. established the 
foundation in 1958. Its purpose is to 
seek out, recognize and reward 
leadership potential in high school 
sophomores. The Foundation's 
program is basically simple: bring a 
select group of high school 
sophomores with demonstrated 
leadership qualities together with a 
group of distinguished leaders in 
business, education, government 
and the professions and let the two 
interact. 

Through annual all-expense-paid 
seminars at the state and 
international levels, these 10th 
graders get a realistic look at what 
makes the American incentive 
system tick, thus better enabling 
them to think for themselves. 

A sampling of this year's topics 
included the following: 
"Entrepreneurship: Who Owns 
American 	Business," 
"Media/Communications: 
Communications in the Electronic 
Age," and "Being the Best You Can 
Be.:" 

"The experience at the HOBY 
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SACRED HEART SCHOOL 
S.N.A.P. MENUS 

May 10.14 
Mon. - Tacos, cheese, lettuce, 

tomatoes, ranch style beans, fruit, 
bread, milk. 

Tues. - Chili Con Came, pinto 
beans, salad, cobbler, crackers, 
milk. 

Wed. - Chicken Pot Pie, cheese 
sticks, tole slaw, pineapple, bread, 
milk. 

Thur. - Mexican Casserole, ranch 
style beans, salad, fruit, cookies, 
milk. 

Fri. - Cheeseburgers 
w/Trimmings, French fries, ice 
cream, milk. 

LINDSAY LUNCH MENU 
May 10 - 14 

Mon. - Corny Dogs, baked beans, 
rice, fruit cobbler, bread, milk 

Tues. - Beef A Roni, tossed salad, 
corn, batterbread, fruit, milk. 

Wed. - Fiesta Salad, applesauce, 
assorted fruit, bread, milk. 

Thur. - Hamburgers 
w/Trimmings, fries, ice cream, 
milk. 

Fri. - Barbecue Chicken, pinto 
beans, potato salad, assorted fruit, 
bread, milk. 

FORESTBURG MENU 
May 10 - 14 

Mon. - LUNCH: Burritos, 
French fries, corn, applesauce, cake, 
milk. BREAKFAST: Cereal, juice, 
milk. 

Tues. - LUNCH: Broccoli and 
Chicken Rice Casserole, green 
beans, lettuce and tomato salad, 
peaches. BREAKFAST: Cinnamon 
Toast, juice, milk. 

Wed - LUNCH: Pinto and Butter 
Beans, macaroni and tomatoes, 
spinach, cornbread, fruit gelatin, 
milk. BREAKFAST: Donuts, juice, 
milk. 

Thur. - LUNCH: Taco Salad, 
cheese, crackers, lettuce and tomato, 
ranch style beans, raisins, chocolate 
pudding, milk. BREAKFAST: 
Biscuit and Gravy w/Sausage, juice, 
milk. 

Fri. - NO SCHOOL! 
ERA ISD LUNCH MENU 

May 10 - 14 
Mon. - Fish Sticks w/Tartar 

Sauce, corn, sweet peas, hot rolls, 
butter, peaches w/whipped topping, 
milk. 

Tues. - Tacos, shredded cheese, 
trimmings, refried beans, cornbread, 
butter, milk. 

Wed. - Spaghetti w/Meat Sauce, 
salad, green beans, pudding, milk. 

Thur. - Steak Fingers, gravy, 
mashed potatoes, rice, cherry 
cobbler, milk. 

Fri. - Hamburger, cheese slice, 
trimmings, French fries, ice cream, 
milk. 

MUENSTER LUNCH MENU 
May 10 - 14 

Mon. - Corny Dogs, French fries. 
macaroni and cheese, fruit, milk. 

Tues. - Chicken Pot Pie, lettuce 
salad, fruit, rolls, milk. 

Wed. - Lasagna, green beans, 
lettuce salad fruit, bread, milk. 

Thur. - Barbecue Sandwich, 
potato chips, fruit, brownies, milk. 

Fri. - Sandwiches, nachos, fruit, 
cake, milk. 

JOE HOENIG 

23 at Stanford House in Gainesville 
at 1 p.m. 

The award is sponsored by 
R.S.V.P, the Retired Senior 
Volunteer Program of the Federal 

1.• Domestic Volunteer Agency of 
o Texas Department on Aging and 

'Tri-County Senior Nutrition. 
!. 	Presentation of the award came as 
o the highlight of a program that 

included a Welcome by Joyce 
Malinowsky, Pledge of Allegiance 

b by Charles Evans, Recognition of 
1,  Advisory Council by Robin McCoy, 
?i Invocation by Bill Whitley, 

Entertainment by Tom Carson and a 
ti '40s Musical Review. 

Following the luncheon, the 
Awards presentation included 
Recognition of Volunteer Stations, 
Five-Year Awards and naming the 
R.S.V.P. Volunteer of the Year, Joe 
Hoenig. 

Hoenig's volunteer service was 
conducted mainly at St. Richard's 
Villa, the Saint Jo Nursing Home 
and at the SNAP Center in 
Muenster. 

He has contributed between 1,200 
and 1,300 miles in the conduct of 
his assistance. Activities included 
visiting sick people; volunteer 
barber work for men; playing the 
piano to entertain every Friday at 
the Saint Jo Nursing Center and 
during tine noonmeal; serving Mass 

; evefy Monday for Father Joseph 
• Weinzapfel at St. Richard" Villa; 

on Thursday, he begins his visit at 
St. Richard's at 10:30 a.m. At 
innumerable times, he visits, plays 
the piano, helps with exercises, etc. 
He is always on call and always 
within reach..  

Other volunteers recognized with 
medals or pins for Five-Year 
Awards included these from 
Muenster: Julia Cunningham, 
Florence Fisher, Dorothy M. 
Hartman, Veronica M. Hoagland, 
Joe Hoenig, Rose Hofbauer, Bertha 
Pick, Margaret Schmitt, Charlie A. 

- Stelzer, Violet Stelzer, Agnes 
- Walter, the late Oscar Walter.; 

Susanna Wieler, Al Wiesman, 
Elinor Wiesman, Loretta Wimmer, 
Tony J. Wimmer, all who joined in 
1987. 

Joining in 1988 were the late 
Catherine Hermes, and Bonnie L. 

s  Hess, Margaret Kupper and 
Florence Williams. Irene Wimmer 
and Lawrence Wimmer joined in 
1990. 

Joining in 1992 were Romana 
Bayer, Armella Cler and Arnold H. 
Wimmer; and joining in 1993 was 
Antonio V. Hess. All these were 
from Muenster. Among five-year 

1 awardees were many from a wide 
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Five Muenster tracksters 
compete at regional meet 

.---111101r 
INS 	 

REPRESENTING Lindsay High School at the UR. State Track and Field 
Meet will be, I to r, back - Christy Zimmerer, Rashell Sharp. Janelle 
Hellinger, Keleigh O'Dell, Mary Tepera: front - Donnie Cox. 

Janie Hartman Photo 

Cox gets double gold, 
girls' relays run at state 

girl from Windthorst continues to 
improve and could knock Roxie 
down to 2nd place? 

Freshman Julia Fleitman ran a 
nervous 3200m race Friday morning 
and came in 5th place with a time of 
1102. Friday afternoon, Danell 
Reiter got her best discos throw of the 
season and still finished 7th with a 
1047" toss. "I was really pleased with 
Danell's effort; she has a 10-foot 
improvement over last year," 
commented Roller. 

Dianne Pagel ran her prelims that 
evening, qualifying in both the 100m 
and 300m hurdles. The finals 
Saturday afternoon left her with two 
6th places. A time of 16A in the 
100m hurdles and 48.36 in the 300m 
was recorded. "Dianne messed up on 
the third hurdle in the 100m race," 
said Roller. "That cost her 4 or 5 
yards? 

Mike Hacker, Muenster's lone 
Hornet competitor, threw the shot put 
Saturday morning. His toss of 
13510" was good enough for a 5th 
place. 

Roxie Knabe advances to the State 
Track and Field Meet and is 
scheduled to throw Saturday 
morning, May 15. 

"The entire district was represented 
real well at Regional and will be at 
Austin. That shows we have a very 
competitive district," concluded 
Coach Roller. "We want what works the best 

for everyone, and what will be fun 
for the boys, said Terry. 

If there are any questions, please 
call Terry at 759-2599. See you 
Saturday at 2:00 p.m.! 
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GM°C TRUCK  174  

The Lady Hornets' state runner-
up basketball players were in the 
news again last week_ According to 
the April 29 Fort Worth Star-
Telegram, three Lady Hornets were 
voted on the Class A All-State 
Basketball Team as voted by the 
Texas Sports Writers Association. 

Making the second team were 
Muenster High School juniors Amy 
Otto and Danell Reiter, with 
Theresa Kubis placed on the third 
team. Celeste's Shalonda Enis was 
chosen Player of the Year. 

Muenster ISD's Student Council 
is hosting their annual Seniors vs. 
Faculty Volleyball Game next 
Friday, May 14, at 2:45 pan. in the 
school's gym. All students, parents 
and friends are invited to watch 
and/or cheer for their favorite team. 
Last year, the faculty overwhelmed 
the seniors to win handily. 
Admission will be a can of food to 
benefit the needy of Cooke County. 

"NINJA TURTLES 3" 
..ATE 9408 Pt Za" t Str-PDAY MS PG 

• :Tu. 	 A.Dr 5 v 

COP AND A HALF" 
_ATE WOW MU'S& SA%4ZAY 910 P3 

ars 01.10 	asis. &LSI 
AU. SEATS '2.00 7asaw= 

Pontiac Buick 

A REAL BARGAIN 
We w::: ..aryou wrong when you one in fora terrific deal at Brawn Motor Co. 
1993 Pontiac GrandAm SE Coupe deingibb*.  

agill 	,'- 1-17 1111111.10 - 	/1"N •'-eA-a- 	$23667  ys ,  
 	30 Month. 

I eaaeae 

	
t_ 	' ij 

	

M. 	r 	 -1 
1 . - 

4 	 ,, 

r 

- lew 

• Lady Hornets place 
4th in Regional golf 

Five students from Muenster High 
School participated in the Class A 
um Regional Track and Field Meet 
at Abilene Christian University April 
30 and May 1. 

Roxie Knabe added another gold 
medal to her collection Friday 
morning as her shot put throw of 
409' was good for the championship. 
"Rorie has to work real hard to win 
state," said Coach Grady Roller. "The 

te EDO 
ogling sla  m 	' GEES 	JcklY —e  Bares eckes,  Wont 13  page]. Aas°°  anis Kleineni  

with two rounds of a 115 and 118 at 
regional. Freshman Endres also 
dropped her score by over 20 strokes 
with two impressive rounds of 116 
and 115. 

Advancing to state were Robert i - 
Lee with a 756 score and Bronte with 
773. "Both of these schools have very 
strong golf programs with numerous 
courses to play on," Hess said. 4,, 
Menard finished 3rd with an 831 and -
Muenster 4th at 880. Also, from our 
district, was Alvord, taking 6th place 
with a score of 956, out of 13 teams. 

Coach Hess hopes to keep the golf 
program going in Muenster. "I am 
very excited about the Turtle Hill 
Golf Course opening and their junior 
program for all ages. I feel that now 
that the kids will have easy access to 
the facilities, more will get involved." 

The Lady Hornets would lilce to 
thank Dick Murphy for letting them 
practice at Turtle Hill Golf Course 
and a big thanks to Jim Endres for his 
help. 

This was the 10th season that the 
Muenster girls have advanced to 
Regional in 13 years. 

SA tact  . Jason 

Being 

On April 27 and 28, the Muenster 
High School girls' golf team 
competed in the Region II golf 
tournament in Abilene. "The girls 
played their best as a team, as they 
have all season," said Coach Danna 
Hess. "I was very pleased with 
everybody's scores." The Lady 
Hornets finished the two-day 
tournament with a total of 880 for a 
4th place finish. 

After day one, Muenster was in a 
strong 4th with 438 behind Menard 
with 421. "We knew we could not 
catch 1st or 2nd, so we set our sights 
to finish 3rd or 4th," continued Hess. 
Both days the girls had consistent 
scores. Brandi Crewing was the top 
player with scores of 100 and 104. 
Lori Graham made her 4th trip to 
Abilene in golf, shooting a 104 both 
days. 

"The two newcomers played their 
best rounds ever," Hess said of 
Allison Klement and DaLana Endres. 
"This was Allison's first year and she 
continued to improve as the season 
progressed." Klement dropped her 
score over 20 strokes since district, 

Coach pitch is on the ball; 
parents' meeting May 8 

ROME ICNABE 

Donnie Cox brought home gold 
medals from Regional last weekend 
as did the girls' 400m and 800m relay 
teams. 

The girls' 400m relay team's 
winning time was 50.89 with Keleigh 
ODell, Mary Tepera, Rashell Sharp 
and Janelle Hellinger setting a new 
school record. The 800m relay team 
of Mary Tepera, Rashell Sharp, 
Christy Zimmerer and Janelle 
Hellinger also set a new school 
record at 1:46.34 for the gold medal. 

Cox won the 110m high hurdles 
with a time of 14.86. "Donnie had 
problems in the prelims, not 
qualifying real well," said Coach 
George Thomason. "But be had clear 
sailing in the outside lane in the 
finals." Cox also took the gold in the 
300m hurdles with a winning time of 

SH Athletics Banquet 
features SMU's Rhompola 

Jr 

40.46. 
Tbe Knightettes' 1603m relay team 

came in 6th place. Sherry Hess, 
Tammy Wilson, Brandi Berner and 
Rashell Sharp ran in the finals as 
Janette Hettinger assisted in the 
prelims before being replaced by 
Rashell Sharp. 

Sharp also finished 6th in the long 
jump with a 167-3/4" jump, less than 
6" to being 1st place. Christy 
Zimmerer participated in the 200m, 
but did not qualify for the finals. 

George Lutkenhaus and Doug 
Hellinger both ran in the 1600m run. 
Lutkenhaus' time of 4:49.64 was 
good for a 5th place as Hettinger 
finished 8th with 4:59.23. 

The five girls and one guy will 
compete at the State Track and Field 
Meet May 15-16 in Austin. 

Muenster Jaycees' new Coach 
Pitch League is on its way! There 
has been very good reponse to this 
league, and now it is time for 
discussion. Because of this league 
being new this year, there is much 
to decide on and discuss. 

Terry Walterscheid, chairman of 
the Coach Pitch League is asking 
that one parent of each boy that has 
signed up please try to attend the 
meeting on Saturday. May 8. The 
meeting will be at the Muenster 
Jaycees' Meeting room at the 
Muenster City Park at 2:00 p.m. 
Terry Walterscheid really needs 
your imput so try and make 
- LPlease, do not bring your child. 

DID YOU KNOW  A Plea for Umpires 
for Little League 

Games 
sponsored by Muenster Jaycees 

Umpires are needed for Little League Baseball 
games, three nights a week during the season. 
Umpires will be paid for each game worked. 

Call Ron Trubenbach 759-4140 E  

Several junior high tracksters 
were incorrectly identified in last 
week's Enterprise pictures. Kami 
Barnhill threw the shot, not her 
sister Karri. Also, Michael 
Montgomery, not Grewing, was the 
dimanee runner and Bryan Hudspeth 
was caught clearing the hurdle 
instead of Scott Hermes. Sorry for 
those and any other mistakes that 
were printed. 

Lindsay's golf, 
teams compete 
at Regional 

Sacred Heart High School has at 7 p.m. in the Sacred Heart 
chosen Thursday. May 13, for the Community Center. 
annual Athletic Awards Banquet_ 
Jack Murdock, Sacred Heart 
principal, will be the master of 
ceremonies. 

The guest speaker will be 
Rhonda Rhompola In her 10th year 
at Southern Methodist University, 
Rhompola has taken the Lady 
Mustangs to the N.I.T. tournament_ 
Coach Rhompola was an All-
American basketball player at Old 
Dominion University in Virginia, 
playing in two national 
championships and was SMU's first 
All-American player. In this, her 
second year as women's head 
basketball coach at SMU, she was 
chosen as Southwest Conference 
Coach of the Year. 

Special 	guest, 	Vicki 
Walterscheid, will also be in 
attendance. Vicki is a 1988 graduate 
of SHHS and helped the Tigereues 
win state championship baskethrdl  
tides in 1986 and 1988. Her college 
career began at Sam Houston 
University and ended at SMU what 
she had a definite impact on the 
success of the Lady Mustang team. 
Vicki is the daughter of Raymond 
and Peggy Walterscheid. 

Tickets may be purchased for 
$5.00 at Sacred Heart School from 
Mary Bayer. The banquet will begin 

Valley View Athletic Director 
Mark Davidson has resigned 
effective at the end of the school 
year Davidson, 37, led the Valley 
View High School Eagles to the 
1992 Class A state semi-finals in 
football. 

Lindsay High School was 
represented at Regional competition 
in both golf and tennis last week. 

Darren Hundt, as an individual 
medalist, finished 13th out of over 80 
golfers at last Monday and Tuesday's 
meet at Maxwell Golf Course in 
Abilene. "He did real well the first 
day, but his spirit dropped Tuesday," 
commented Lindsay Golf Coach Tom 
Fluker. Hundt hit an 80 Monday, but 
took 90 strokes the second day for a 
170 score. The gold medal winner hit 
a 155 score. 

Freshman Trsha Wang took to the 
H.S.U. courts in Abilene, finishing 
3rd place in Regional competition. 
Tike won her first matches 6-0, 6-0 
against Rising Star and Wiles High 
Schools. The next round put her up 
against  441 seed Chillicothe, losing 0-
6, 1-6. Chillicothe went on to win the 
championship. Wang then defeated 
Painted Rock 6-1, 6-1. In her match 
for 2nd place, Tisha lost 1-6, 4-6 
settling for a 3rd-place medal. 

In boys singles, Toby Eberhart and 
Will Thomason both lost their 
opening matches. Eberhart lost 6-2, 
6-2 to Sydney with Thomason falling 
short 6-1, 3-6, 4-6 to Marathon_ 

The boys doubles team of Shane 
Hucbton and Jeremy Owen lost 6-2, 
6-2 to #1 seed Painted Rock, who 
took the Regional championship. 

* STATE TWIN* 
211412.Ceilaress &sib N6-2741 1,31GICSub 
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WE ARE NOW TAKING RESERVATIONS 

FOR PRIVATE BIRTHDAY PARTIES 

AND GROUP FUNCTIONS. 

h Stai end 
Delivery &in 

Chant F`rt 

The Montague Volunteer Fire 
Department will host its annual 
fundraiser on May 8 on the north 
side of the square in MontagueFor  
donations or more information, 
contact Tommy Fenoglio at 894-
3422 or any member. 

IN 	I ' 1 	NO 
_rams 

The 2nd Annual Pioneer Days 
Softball Tournament, sponsored by 
the Saint Jo Chamber of Commerce, 
has been set far May 28, 29, 30. 

Entry fee is $110 with a limit set 
at 12 teams. Deadline is set for 
Tuesday, May 25. A required 
deposit of S50 is to be received by 
the deadline date. 

Contact Pedigo Insurance Agency 
from 9 am. to 5 p.m. at 817-995-
2424. Shirts will be awarded to the 
top three teams. 

All games will be played at the 
Saint Jo Softball Field located at 
Boggess Park. 

THE FUN PLACE TO MEET YOUR FRIENDS*  
BRING YOUR OATE OR JUST HANG OUT 

Soroptimist International of 
Gainesville has announced its 3rd 
annual Swing Into Spring charity 
golf tournament for women golfers 
to be held at the Gainesville 
Municipal Golf Course on Tuesday, 
May 11, at 9 am. 

The format will be a two-person 
scramble, three flights. Golfers can 
choose their partner and their 
foursome, if they wish; or players 
will be paired. 

Further information concerning 
this golf tournament can be obtained 
from Janis Cravens, 817-665-1071 
or 665-6244. 

HOURS 
Fri. 6:00-12:00 

Set. 5:00-12;00 

Sun. 5:00-10:00 
an 

 

We are pleased to announce the relocation 
of our office to 

117 N. Commerce, Gainesville 

WALLACE INGLISH 

 

 

Certified Financial Planner 

   

 

Bus. (817) 665-5863 
Res. (817) 768-2719 

(800) 794-6476 
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POOL TABLES 
VIDEO GAMES 
SHALT BAR 
MINIATURE GOLF 

4 BrownMotor Corn 
::::i 	--- 
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T-Ball Application 

r — 
Girl's Softball 

/if 	

Muenster League 
Ages 9 to 15 invited 

Please leave completed  form at Tops arid Teams by 
May 21.1993 

$10.00 fee - to corer trophies, drinks for the girls after every game (to 

avoid parents haring to bring it in) Money win be used for the girls - money 

left ova will be used for end of the season party. ?knit if there are any 

questions please caII 759-4449 
We, the uaderngocd parew or guardiaa hereby give permission for =child to play 

Girl's Salted in the Muenster League in the summer 41993, and I hereby release and 
hold harmless the spOOS012, prancers and all older penmen and entitles, thee agar and 
anises, anocumd .nth this League from any liability far all injury ar damage my child 
a chikkea may mania labeibta a be CalatitbinaCCideal. 	Cr far my "eager of de sponsors a promotets or other persons a rota  their agents a ariagas, associated 

with this even d their employees. or atherwite.Call Randy Randall 759-4449 for info_ 
!rite 	 Age 
Adebes 	  

NOCONA- 

ROPER 
$6500 

LIZARD!  
$1290( 

1 Name 	 

Address 

Phone 	  Sex M 
What grade will you be in next year? 	  

Birthdate: 
In case of emergency, call parent 	  
Address 

Phone 
Alternate emergency tail, other responsible person 

A 

38 Month Smart Buy - $1500 Cash or Trade Down Plus IT&L WAC 
See Dealer for Details 

Phone 	  Relationship 	  
Family Physican 	  

Phone 	  
T-Shirt Sizes: circle S. S(6-8) M(10-12) L(14-16) 

PARENTAL PERMISSION (please read carefully) 
I give my child permission to participate in the summer T-ball program, and I will 
assist in observing the rules and regulations set up for the league and I will 
stress to my child that he/she also observe the same rules and regulations. I 
understand that reasonable measures will -ire taken to safeguard the health and 
safety of my child and I will be notified as soor. as possible in the event of 
sickness or accident In case of sickness or accident. I authorize the calling of a 
doctor and/or provicing the other necessary first aid or medical services at my 
own expense. I also will not hold the Muenster ICC. Chapter responsible for any 
accidents afflicted to my child while playing or practicing the sport of T-ball. 

Applications are due May 27, 1993! 
Please turn your application in to Tops 8 Teams 

1993 Buick LeSabre 
Telephone 	  Birthday --/_/ 
Last Year's Team 	 First Year 	Cl 

trot t111k 
DATE PARENT OR GUARDIAN 

Your parents insert sign! 

We need coaches and umpires 
to volunteer their time! 

L 	Please, call 759-4449 Date 

Brown Motor Compdn.  y, Inc. 
Monday -Friday:00 - 8:00 

Saturday 8:00 - 6:00 
EllghwaY 82 (817) 665-5591 Signed 

L Parent or Guardian must sign 

r 

r 



NOCONA 

ROPERS 
	$6500 
LIZARDS 
	$129m 

Prices Good thru May 22, 1993 

502 Field Street, Gainesville, Texas, 665-7062 
57 I f 
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SACRED HEART TIGERS earning state medals in track were, I to r, 
back - Jason Hess, Werner Becker, Jody Fleitman, Kelly Bayer, Neil 
Berres; front - John Klement, Chris Pagel, Aaron Berres, Michael Becker. 

Janie Hartman Photo 

Oil news from Railroad 
Commission of Texas 

Lindsay Honor Roll 

State Auditor released its 
assessment of Texas' oil field 
cleanup programs, which involves 
the plugging of abandoned oil wells 
and the clean-up of oil field surface 
sites to prevent potential pollution 
of fresh water. 

According to Nabers, the 
Railroad Commission began 
stepping up efforts once the fund 
was established and monies became 
available. "In fiscal year 1992, the 
agency collected $9.5 million in 
fees and spent $9.42 million on 
clean-up programs. So far in fiscal 
year 1993, we have collected $6 
million and have spent $5.3 
million," Nabers said. 

The Texas Railroad Commission 
reports having plugged a total of 
1324 wells in fiscal year 1992, the 
first full year of the program. In the 
first six months of fiscal year 1993, 
the Commission has plugged 925 
wells. Nabers said that prior to the 
establishment of the industry clean-
up fund in late 1991, an average of 
500 wells were plugged each year. 
The Railroad Commission has 
stated that there are likely 35,000 
abandoned wells that may require 
plugging in the future. The audit 
report, however, says there could be 
twice that amount. 

s' meet) 

RRC sets Texas gas production 
allowables, reviews oil purchaser 

nominations for May 
Railroad Commissioner 

Chairman James E. (Jim) Nugent 
and Commissioners Mary Scott 
Nabers and Barry Williamson 
forecast Texas oil production for 
May at 1,711,599 barrels per day, 
based on purchaser nominations. 
The nominations total, a decrease of 
11,257 barrels daily when compared 
to April 1993 purchaser 
nominations, estimates Texas oil 
purchases in the coming month. 
May 1992 nominations totaled 
1,769,127 barrels daily. 

Nugent reported that crude oil 
and petroleum products imported 
into the U.S. averaged 8,147,000 
barrels per day for the month of 
February 1993. This was an 
increase of 1,393,000 barrels per 
day from the same period a year 
ago. 

RRC assesses $180,500 in well 
plugging 

The Railroad Commission levied 
$180,500 in penalties the week of 
April 22 to 25 oil and gas operators 
for violations under Commission 
well-plugging and pollution rules. 

To date in 1993, the Railroad 
Commission has assessed $908,268 
in well- plugging and pollution 
penalties, compared to $359,666 in 
such penalties levied during the 
same period last year. 

Railroad Commissioner Nabers 
says environmental clean-up 

efforts are high priority 
"Protecting the environment is a 

job that takes more than just the 
enactment of state and federal laws 
- it takes time, money and 
expertise," Texas Railroad 
Commissioner Mary Scott Nabers 
said recently, after the Office of the 

Pitch is on the ball' 
ng May 8 

• -4;it "•-e 

IN OBSERVANCE of the Week of the Young Child and Earth Day, 
some of the children from Tender Loving Care Day Care Center planted 
an oak tree outside the Muenster Memorial Hospital. The gesture was 
made in memory of Dr. Enrique Juarez. Pictured, I to r, are Emily Endres, 
Jordan Walterscheid, Billy Haverkamp, Micah Flusche, Zachary 
Swirczynski, Craig Grewing, Cori Hayes, Brad Endres, Evan Koester, 
Amanda Rohrer and Chad Endres. Several mothers and Dr. Alfredo 
Antonetti also attended. 	 Janet Felderhoff Photo 

Fifth Six Weeks 
High School - Suzann 

Hellinger, Doug Hellinger, Darren 
Hundt, Tisha Wang, Jason Hsu, 
Tanner Neidhardt, Michael 
Schmidlkofer, Christy Zimmerer, 
Janine Sorrenson, Stephany 
Pearson, Allison Walterscheid, 
Chad Hair, Matthew Murrell, 
Christi Secrest, Leslie Cler, Sherry 
Hess, April Sandmann, Dave 
Brown, Janelle Fuhrmann, Sabrina 
Nagy, Christine Fuhrmann, Jennifer 
Bezner, Tammy Wilson, Kyle 
Sandmann, Charlene Lutkenhaus, 
Michelle DeBorde, Mary Tepera, 
Sara Flusche, Will Thomason, 
Keleigh O'Dell, Janette Hellinger. 

8th Grade - Jennifer Hoberer, 
Howsen Kwan, Molly Trammell, 
Erin Eberhart, Amanda Schad, 
Chasa Webb, Richard Haayen, 
Zachery Bowman. 

Without calcium, 
yotid be running 
on empty. 

7th Grade - Carrie Hundt, 
Connie Wang, Sadie Trammell, 
Jamie Zwinggi, Ashley Zimmerer, 
Asad Ratunan, Lisa Mosman, Keith 
Fuhrmann, Amanda Hellinger, Jeff 
Sicking, Dan Sorrenson, Abbie 
Bezner. 

6th Grade - Elizabeth Luttmer, 
Amy Arendt, Emily Zimmerer, 
Nick Price, Levi Seeds, Erica 
Fuhrmann, Jennifer Otto, Joey 
Wilson, Amy Sandmann, Shane 
Hair, Scott Arendt, Amy Hoberer, 
Richie Alfrey, Chris Garner, Gayle 
Walterscheid. 

5th Grade - James Thomason, 
Scott Metzler, Leah Hermes, Abbas 
Ravjani, Diana Schad, Daniel 
Hellinger, Karen Cler, Courtney 
Hoelker, Ali Rahman, Brent Krebs, 
Clint Metzler, Leslie Schumacher, 
Abby Trammell, Sarah Trammell, 
Justin Graham. 

"We warn what for e 	-t works the  veryone, and what 	best 
for Use boys said Terri 	be full  If there 
call Terryale  anY questions. please 
S 	al 759'2598 S aturdaY al 2'00 pm.! 	Y°11 
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TIGERETTES state track medalists are, I to r, back - Donetta Hess, Kelly 
Reigler, Jennie Endres, Stephanie Grewing, Kelly Dangelmayr; front - 
Sarina Fuhrmann, ICarri Endres, Julie Felderhoff, Erica Schilling, Tiffany 
Fisher. Not pictured are April Truebenbach and Deann Bayer. 

Janie Hartman Photo 

Seventh Grade District Track Results 
Discus 31'5" 

28'2" 
26'5" 
262" 
25'11" 

P 
L 
P 
L 

Sallee 
Crutsinger 
Bobb 
Garcia 

69'11" 
59'10" 
571/2" 
50 1/2 
43'8" 
40'8" 

Boydstun M 
Wisian 
Perryman M 
Hartman M 
Williams 	E 

Discus 
Perryman M 
Lester 	VV 

2nd 
3rd 
4th 
5th 
6th 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 
5th 
6th 

L 
M 
VV 
L 

Baggs 
Boydstun 
Prescher 
Fuhrmann 

84'8" 
83'10" 
80'9" 
73'4" 
70'4" 
69'0" 

7th GRADE BOYS 
400 Meter Relay - 1st, Lindsay, 

56.26; 2nd, Muenster, 56.93; 3rd, 
Era, 58.18; 4th, Valley View, 59.65; 
5th, Ponder, 59.84. 1600 Meter 
Relay - 1st, Muenster, 4:27.33; 2nd, 
Lindsay, 4:32.29; 3rd, Valley View, 
4:42.36; 4th, Era, 4:46.13; 5th, 
Ponder, 4:46.30. 

Shot Put 
1st Krahl 	VV 33'8" 

Pecos time 
Step into easy 

livin'... 

A Plea for Umpires 
for Little League 

Games 
sponsored by Munster Jaycees 

t needed for Little League Baseball 
!e nights a week during the season./  
hill be paid for each game worked. 

In Trubenbach 759-4140 i 

A favorite! 12" boot with pull straps, 
full-grain oil-tanned Velva Retan 

leather, inch-wide steel shank, 
oil-and-slip resistant 

Neoprene cork soles. 

BEST 

AUTO 
DEALS 

INTHE 
WEST 

1177 

. AIM  I  ileglin• 	1  lint11111  
Or in the East, North 

or South, for that 

I 

matter. We're smiling 
when we say that, and 
you will be too when 

you deal with nal 
BROWN MOTOR iliP  

\ COMPANY 

olim  GMC TRUCK  ca Ili 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 
5th 
6th 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 
5th 
6th 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 
5th 

1st 
2nd 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 

-we WAYNE'S 
G 

LOST LUGGAGE R -SCIZNS 
209 N. Commerce, Gainesville 	Made in U.S.A. 1993 GMC Suburban 

(MAI. 11•41••••••01.1,1•••••• 

1993CE Sonoma Club Coupe 
(paid 43 V6 solo Innis:m[0n IMIATURI GOLF i US D 

=Rs 665-9084 Gelsestillultui 
4 

titian, Mi. Yd., al autt.M4CIA 
camps do  mat 450299 

LA316213W 

Long Jump 
1st Bostick 	P 162" 
2nd Covington 	L 	14'6" 
3rd Tepera 	L 13'9" 
4th Anderson P 13'2" 
5th Whitt 	E 1311" 
6th Walterscheid M 	1310" 

Triple Jump 
1st Covington L 30'4" 
2nd Hermes 	M 28'5" 
3rd Costin 	L 269" 
4th Root 	L 20'10" 

High Jump 
1st Alexander VV 5'2" 
2nd Anderle 	M 4'10" 
3rd Logan 	E 4'9" 
4th Grant 	VV 4'8" 
5th Sparkman M 4'8" 
6th Costin 	L 4'8" 

2400 Meter Run 
1st Walterscheid M 9:07.67 
2nd Sicking 	L 9:31.24 
3rd Fuhrmann L 9:33.93 
4th Escobedo M 9:40.75 
5th Sandmann L 9:50.08 
6th Hellman 	M 10:05.36 

800 Meter Run 
1st Alexander VV 2:38.91 
2nd Tipps 	VV 2:47.40 
3rd Graves 	E 2:53.72 
4th Costin 	L 2:55.46 
5th Amarso 	E 3:1229 
6th Davis 	E 3:22.63 

110 Meter Hurdles 
1st Tepera 	L 20.39 
2nd Hudspeth 	M 20.58 
3rd Fleitman(am) M 21.03 
4th Ivic 	E 21.16 
5th 	Fleitman miss M 22.25 
6th Logan 	E 22.28 

100 Meter Dash 
1st Bostic 	P 13.08 
2nd Hermes 	M 13.65 
3rd Zimmerer L 13.78 
4th Martindale VV 14.09 
5th Fuhrmann L 14.17 
6th Sparkman M 14.28 

400 Meter Dash 
1st Covington L 1:03.66 
2nd Sicking 	M 1:04.37 
3rd Hale 	P 1:06.35 
4th Alexander VV 1:08.07 
5th Baggs 	L 1:09.28 
6th Twiner 	E 1:13.28 

300 Meter Hurdles 
1st Hudspeth M 53.72 
2nd Fleitman (Brian) M 55.28 
3rd Ivic 	E 55.68 
4th 	Fleitman (limy) M 	57.01 
5th Tepera 	L 58.81 
6th Wolf 	E 1:00.63 

200 Meter Dash 
1st Win 	E 28.39 
2nd Moths 	P 28 51 
3rd Bostic 	P 28.99 
4th Brinkley 	VV 29.29 
5th Sparkman M 30.18 
6th Anderle 	M 31.22 

1600 Meter Run 
1st Sicking 	L 5:50.53 
2nd Walterscheid M 5:52.07 
3rd Escobedo M 6:10.25 
4th Sandmann L 6:15.40 
5th Heflin 	VV 6:22.69 
6th Fuhrmann L 6:25.00 

• • $12 999 
1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 
5th 

• • • • • •  

In Stock and Ready for 
Delivery. Several to 

Choose Prom 

L1 littl 4 Mug 
- 
Brown Motor Corn  •  an , Inc. 

Stevens 
Bowles 

Long Jump 
Hellinger L 12'4" 
Hillis 	E 	12'4" 
Matthews E 173" 
Crider 	P 	12'1/2" 
Taylor 	L 	11'11" 
Zimmerer L 10'11" 

Triple Jump 
Trammell L 22'11" 
Zwinggi L 217" 
Hundt L 269" 

High Jump 
Hellinger L 4'2" 
Bobb 	P 4'2" 
DeBorde L 42" 
Wallum P 4'0" 
Taylor L 4'0" 

2400 Meter Run 
Hundt L 11:39.36 
Bowman L 12:53.29 

800 Meter Run 
Trammell L 2:52.95 
Zwinggi L 3:04.59 
Stoffels 	L 	3:11.68 
Bowles E 3:4830 

100 Meter Hurdles 
Matthews E 21.46 
Bobb 	P 21.65 
Bomar E 21.75 
Orsburn L 22.92 
Coin 	L 22.96 

100 Meter Dash 
Hettinger 	L 	14.19 
Lockhart E 14.49 
Lyons E 15.00 
Hale 	L 15.45 
Purser P 16.60 
Endres M 16.84 

400 Meter Run 
Lockhart E 1:16.98 
Hale 	L 1:17.95 
Hillis 	E 	1:19.94 
Fuhrmann L 1:24.44 

300 Meter Hurdles 
Sandmann L 55.58 
Zimmerer L 59.76 
DeBorde L 1:02.79 
Bomar E 1:04.75 
Crider 	P 	1:05.77 
Matthews E 1:08.05 

200 Meter Dash 
Lyons E 32.92 
Hill 	E 33.19 

1600 Meter Run 
Trammell L 6:22.32 
Zwinggi L 6:49.45 
Stoffels 	L 	7:01.17 

alk 

Silver Spur 
Lindsay, Texas 

RE NOW TAKING RESERVATIONS 

PRIVATE BIRTHDAY PARTIES 

GROUP FUNCTIONS. 

FUN PLACE TO MEET YOUR FNIENOSIA, 

NO YOUR GATE OR JUST HANG OUT P
4  

POOL TABLES 
VIDEO GAMES 
SNACK BAR .. 
MINIATURE GOLF 

Presents this Friday, Saturday & Sunday 

Gaines vibe 
Ellighway 82 (817) 6436-8581 

Mon -Fai. 8:00-6:00, Bat. 8:00-6:00 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 
5th 
6th 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 

"The Bandits" 31 
42:00 
.1200  
40:00 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 
4th 
5th 
6th 

......... I ....... 
all Application 

Sun. Nile 
Dance Lessons 

by  Jerry and Virginia 

C OPEN THUFtS. - SAT. 8pm - 2 am 
OPEN SUNDAY 7 pm - 2 am 

DRINK SPECIALS 8 -10 NIGHTLY 

1st 
2nd 

1st 
2nd 
3rd 

C 

Sex M 
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7th GRADE GIRLS 
400 Meter Relay - 1st, Lindsay, 

59.00; 2nd, Era, 1:03.38; 3rd, 
Ponder, 1:04.19.800 Meter Relay -
1st, Era, 2:11.24; 2nd, Lindsay, 
2:1125; 3rd, Ponder, 2:35.96. 1600 
Meter Relay - 1st, Lindsay, 
5:03.24; 2nd, Ponder, 5:45.34; 3rd, 
Era, 5:53.32. 

Shot Put 
1st Sallee 	P 21'4" 
2nd Crutsinger L 	20'3" 
3rd Bowles 	E 18'8" 
4th Nelson 	P 187" 
5th Hale 	L 17'10" 
6th Stevens 	L 179" 
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See Us for Your 

Roses s4"ea. 
Flower & Vegetable 

Bedding Plants  
Hanging Baskets 

Nonce 
Crepe Myrdes 
and Shrubbery  

Tony's Seed and 
Feed 

mad Greeakewe 
1211 N. Dar. Gam-rill. 

Trailer Part,  
and Supplie,  

Structural Si; 
and Pipe 

Komplete Line 
of Bolts and 

Miscellaneou, 
Hardware 

METAL 
SALES 

-• 	On Highway 82 
* 	West of Gainesville 

Brown 

Motor 
Company 

!cm( th, Nrra 	in 
Dash= Era 1st- SC ten 

1992 Cadillac 
Sedan Devine 
'Laster- CLIO 

3 To Choose Fro- 
- 

1992 Chevy 
Lumina Euro Sedan 
Loaded - Frt Wean 

1991 Che- vrolet 
Extended Cab 

M.= Mks. 1.303 

1989 Chevrolet 34 Ton 
est Lam' Owe. Ent Gear 

1989 Chevrolet Astro 
Van RS 

Loa ' Ore. Em Der 

1991 GMC Jimmy 2 Dr 
Law ales - LB= '-ore 

1992 Chevy 
Astrid Van at. 

Fairy Warm - Law tie 
-3 t Crease 

1992 Pontiac- Sunbinl 
Cainerlible 

Este Glean- F-ay Wormy 

1978 Chevy Impala 
1 Own0 Lon Weep. 

Ear Clean 

1992 Po- ntine 
Bonneville SE 

Loa Wms. Eatery Warmly 

1976 Chevy 1,2 Ton 
Pickup 

aseftes Ste, P Enid 

Newman Sid Boat Trailer 
Eta Not. Low Prise 

1999 Chevrolet 1:7 Ton 
SWB 

W. S Sae!, 544: One Ore. 
Er re Clean 

1984 Chevrolet HD 3/4 
Ton 4:4 

VS. 4 Speed, 4W Soh& 
Writ Tuck 

1990 Chevrolet 
HD 3/4 Ton 

VEL Monadic, Loaded 491( 
Slam One One 

1999 GIIC Su- burban 
bane& Extra Mee 

1901 Pontiac- 4 Door 
Greed 

Loadar: boa tra: :rote 
ran 1;15 - 

Brown Motor 
Company, Inc. 
Hwy. 82 Gainesville 

(817) 665-5591 

North Texas Communications Co. 
20511 *aim abseeste• 739 2251 

'Fr-En:Ent 	5.::ers.,,E. 
Comment engessmati stmt. 

TnLPL:0,L A n:rnrs -ecEn."-'es 
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- z at' -a-- 
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met rare 
ranee. v. savor. 

ant in a pmeartmc ; 
',sr-N.1 Ewer.. 

-JrnbeaCO 
shwa- Penn 

=a h Met 
&an 
Des Jews 
Sues 28-46 
29 - M bath 
9 &Ma atm 

Commerce 
Street Store 
.!. -.snit.' GSM 'S& - tale lapsed's 

WHOLESALE & 
ar RETAIL 

MEATS  

-de 

759-2744 

10014ga°  

Daily field DaY '54  

iaaya

ssosisestigiIvIThestesbady:ziaiiityol:acsajirtel ::siptag.tet toos3Tviriti  lyr70:1 clerizerdissiretitscsbedigaicipic Truntla ,E:onsdo  

;Ltraciabe 	AterlEiscone4-3 
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Relax ...let The Enterprise Classifieds 
Work For You! 759-4311 .4- 0 
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MISCELLANEOUS 
SERVICES 

I 	FOR SALE 	I REAL ESTATE 

TENDER LOVPSG CARE 
DayeseCems,759-49611 

4A-XE 

FOR SALE: '-piece young 
boys NFL bedroom set. 
Inclodes emu& (all beMbaj). 
clam of drawers, orghntaad, 
desk, data bonkrne and 
locker. Call 759-2520 or 759-
4818. 

S Party Yard 
and Carport Sale 
Friday. May 7 8.6 

386 Ammar pia* 3930 
nfle. 512 rale: 5112 n 10 

=Evened calk flair ex 10 
min wales 3g en h&c 5 
F not worm. desk. GM 

abuts, Mr dame to 
cod Mks; a =lint 

dshes. Stier: :who, & war.  
Thoth tan Mumr. .he 
natty tares left say left 

(Pinar Growth Rd Ithi Int 

REAL ESTATE RROREFt 
Banded nth estate broke 
qualified io an as arc ',-
SAPS or Tamils. Henn 
Weinamdd, 759-225. 1/41,f 
scer Setae Bank, 799.4161. 63. 
WeinzapfelS, 

FOR SALE: Scaled tads evil 
be acrepted mprosiramely 
33 nes at land 6 mum 
portant of Mama Texas, 
nail Mae 1, 1993. Seed bids 
to: Regime Fist 9)1 North 
Milkr Sam Decant Texas 
?tint AI a lee reserved 

accep or reject 'ayes all 

ONO
NM Mark the anelope BID 

LAND_ Fcr inforam, 
call (817) 627-2421 sr (617) 
668-78/8. 

_s  

BEAUTIFUL 3-2-2 bas far 
ale ix Mara 759-4498. 

Lawn Senice 
Mowing-Edgtt-Trimming 
Lam. Lars &Calera, 

DOuolas Fleiz man _ 

CATTLE FOR SALE 25 
mimed pan. Call 759-4906. 
	 Gnat 
FOR SALE: Waxed PECAN 
GRAFTWOOD Choctaw; 
Gramm; Sion& Marsam. 75 
mss ea IJrbu Earl= (817) 
759-33- 
	 asote 
FOR SALE: 6 750890 mud 
grip tires. good emetic* 
named a wheels. 4 1000a20 
mod grip tires. 70% wn. 
Rabe Tire and Radar. Can Evenings 

Don Flusche 
Real Estate Broker 

759-2832 

WE 	• ALTOLICEW 
seam 	a era Tegs aat 
Tat 	N_ Mom, Mnen- 

lam 

BEAUTIFUL MOBILE 
HOMES. 2 and 3 bedroom. 
glamour bath. any Mathew 
and almaMy mac it Rae 
Moody and. folks, if you we 
Mem and sincere help to ass 
your very ma home Ern the 

HAY FOR SALE: Gene and

porn to call 1.606.109x42. 

Andy Menem haw baromeed 
red-k9 cane hay. Small square -
hales Never mood osCall 
759-4554 nights. 

aisme  

PAULI. HESS NO 1 Kansas fi 
Alfalfa bay for sale. Any 

nrim  il-9228- 

	 yes

SED65-1WIGT  CARS 
TRUCYS evadable all l.  
OVER

the 
nine al Holiday Chevrolet, yy  
Wilkesboro. 668-8152 or sti 
(903)564-3551. 	 e 

tiara  STAVE DISPECTED meat 
jamassMg plant- Bring in 
yam amine] Today. Tam-
sap, Fsiday. Ears Malt 
Marty ,'55-6211-  

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Lanestoe 

Sidchig would like la names 
Scare *asks to Farher Vicar 
and Father C.analks for the 
Mau service, fir all the Mass 
offerings. the beautiful airs, 
ads flowen and food, and 
those t

er.
1ped with the 

bandy 	We me grand 
to all our relatives, friends, 
acighbers as ask Cat ici Men 
mai a_ 

FOR HOME DELIVERY Of 
Firm Wash Sue-Telegram 

caillDaie White, 

817-668-2743 

RN-AR CARENTIS, steel 
siding, vinyl Ming, mann& 
non work and mtimalm troll 
759-4559. 	 9.15-1.1 

CARD OF 
THANKS 

RESIDENTIAL bailiftag 
locatioas are available I. 
Cuity Eaaues, Lindsay. 
Texas, intImitag 25 planed 
locations, paved areas and 
Lagoa rabies. Fa more 
nformatioa, 	C03114:11 

Canary Lumber Czeiciamy. 
x•ar.m..„ /co.-.141 

_•.Nar 

Northl 
Comm"8 

conic 

!1/410TOROL  
pHO) 

BA SPECIAL NOTICE 

FOUND I 

NO.13716 
l`s RE THE ESTATE OF 

JAY IN • 'E MILLER DECEASED 
IN THE CD" 	T OF COOKE COINTY. TEICAS 

APPOINT‘EEN 

Car . 

Selthielegan 
Sag Air Citanklag 

amassers 
metartIram Dean  . 
&Sense Mantas 
Meligoassimar • on a 

& easy lee wastrinn 
lass 	wome 

749409 7363093 
TAME 

omen 

FOR SALE.: Nadal Ca 4 
Cada lamina 411-adi ok '''' 

n•build, 31200 or hest offer. I 
used at season riace calm 

Also Power Cat Boat with 75 
hp Evisrode engine, resuraMe. . 
736-234& .4 
	 ss.24 .: 

FOUND! berme Germaides. 
aear Zippet-Sdullieg cm - 
set of GM keys. Identify as 
pay fir ad at The Enterprise- 
	 4311.1.€ 

Uoixigroalatedie  

1992 Upper Elm-Red Soil 

Conservarion District 

CARPENTER WORK 
WANTED 

S DS 
e a;es 

E The IV 2 -tin 759-4650 

Duna &rm. PD. Pa 656, 
- 	m.mtrted ExP.egtor la Came No. 

Miller. Deceased, ace 
vl Cooke County, Texas. 

s 	1...r.: 61i 	. 
u-s day, Apial 27, 1993. 

&William Monroe Millet 
Herr 

	 5_73-E1 
Spuds ne Is W OWLS Fin 

fame .teWhatSPedi  Deals WeHr  

:06:: ST . WS ?WC &-
BRYAN'S 

PAINT & BODY 
• .----am, Srafrtrufc 

Iscv

• 	.. _pa- :Li- 
rs • .ra-cs 11a- : :•-rzerec 
AN SCas 	-9-27tr 

North Texai 
Communications Com 
2.110Eacifigavaig2 HELP WANTED 6i6-2;=" :• "362151 

.:7"-.:25E "21715 	r,J 

H & H Vacuum Service 
Nisr- 	am, 

*HE 7 266tr 7363344b 
Lax;  

Dan G. McBride, M.D. 
Adult & Pediatric Urology 

Ur' a -. 	- C :. ntinence - Treatment of Kidney Stones 
- :: : e - 	- Treatment of Prostate Disease 
0 _- : a-  ent Vasectomy - Female Urology 

Call For Appointment 
(817) 759-2271 

Matti it 
 

MUENSTER MEMORIAL HOSPITAL 
605 North Maple, Muerster, Texas 76252 

IN STOCK 
Electrical- Plumbing 

Paneling • Roofing 
Hardware • Water Pumps 

Heating - Air Conditioning 
We can recommend ar - a • a r. 
Muenster Building 

Center, Inc. PART-TIME HELP 
WANTED: Wedreadays and 
ands_ Apply at Bea 
Frathaa Ministar. 
	 538E 

NOW 	TAKING 
APPLICATIONS err Either 
Sala* CDL license 
lased. Inas: ad abet 
bast Cooke County 
Distrthatiag Co_ 315 it 

Ht.St, Mater. TX, 

Muenster, 759-2232 

NATIONAL PUBLISHING 
FIRM needs pen to label 
postcards from ha SHUN& 
Sea yore on harm Call I-
9013-740-7377 (S1 A9 mat/18 
yrs+) or a PA&SE-0173, 
1
11.

61 s. Liamksway. N. Ann, 
611642- 
	 53-4-EP 

WORK AT 110M t 
Aseembly, ones, typing and 
are! lip in S501100+ a week 
pramilik. Fir ithana wait 
Sin. 7721 A.W- Beata 
la Dept lea Reenina. 

77CEL 

I Congrat 
SI-2,E  

Check Our Great Prices On 

	

WesJEANS 	 

7 5:94144 
	HAMRIC'S 	

Muenster Country Tinting! 
AreiGUNCEMENTS 	Mr. and Mrs. Jack Berry had as 

Don't forget, ladles, to make your  their guests last week Tuesday and 
quilt blocks  for  the  Sam  Bass  quilt Wednesday Calvin and Norma 
so be auctioned or raffled off for the Fletcher 01-  Casper, Wyoming- Faye 
Volunteer Fire Department. Blocks and Lee McKown of Dallas came 

early Wednesday morning and had 
breakfast with them. Wednesday 
afternoon, Wanda and Wilbur 
DeBonie of Era, Dr. and Mrs. Jerry 
McKown, Kimberly and Casey of 
Valley View came and had dimier 
with them_ 

Calvin and Norma Fletcher left 
the Deny home Thursday morning 
for Lubbock to visit his sister, Mrs. 
Myr' Gorey, then return borne. 

Miss Judy Stephenson and Mary 
April of Gainesville and Mary's 
sister and husband, Dottie and Joe, 
of Brooklyn, N.Y. visited the Eterrys 
Thursday afternoon_ 

Mr. and Mrs. I.C. Ban and 
daughter, Mrs. Rattan Harberts of 
Houston, had dinner with Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Berry Friday evening. 

Mrs. Tiana Fletcher of McAllen 
and daughter, Mrs. Lita Siera, and 
her daughter, Mrs. Terry Canada, 
and children Lsmol and Cristina of 
Dallas had lunch with Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Berry Saturday. 

Mrs. Odessa Berry and Mrs. : 
Inez Stevens attended the golden 
wedding anniversary of Mr. and : 
Mrs_ Wayne Moss in the Masonic : 
briikting in Era Sunday evening. 

In and Juanita Bewley of 
Pampa visited Miss Lois Bewley 
and Clyde Tuesday evening. 

Other visitors in the Bewley 
home Sunday were Kenneth Hutson 
and Wayne Hutson of Bloomfield, 
N.M., Barbara and Wes Holley and 
Michel Davis. 

Byron, Deana Colby and Celia' IP 
Berry of Denton visited Mrs. 
Josephine Berry Sunday evening. 

J.C. and Dorothy Barr and 
daughter, Mrs. Barbara Hai-bats of 
Houston, visited Mrs. Deny Friday 

Srnr 
METAL 
SIDING 

and 

Soffits 
• 

69 E 

a 
should be 15-1/2:15-112 inches 
square and turned in by June 1. 

If any questions, call Rita Settle, 
759-4929. 

Mrs. Bula Mae Berry was bitten 
on the left arm by her dog Saturday, 
April 24, as she and the vet were 
attempting to vaccinate him for 
rabies. Her arm has been quite 
painful aid she had to have medical 
attention. But now her arm is 
improving and not so painful 

Bub Mae has also had a problem 
with bees trying to invade her 
fireplace chimney and that created 
another priblem. Bala Mae wishes 
to thank ha friends and neighbors 
for helping her. 

C.D. "Tip" Christian had 
plastic surgery under his eye to 
resolve a cancer cell in Denton 
Regional Hospital and is doing fine. 
Their son, Jimmy, and daughter-in-
law, Sandy. met than in Denton and 
then came home with them. 

Mr. and Mrs. CH. Christian 
visited Miss Johnnie Christian 
Monday, who is recovering from a 
broken hip in Denton Regional 
Hospital and is doing fine. 

Timmy Christian and son Rickey 
Christian of Springtown visited Mr. 
and Mrs. CH. Christian Tuesday 

- and helped Tip work dallie. 
Bill Christian and grandson 

Austin of Stephenville visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Cii. Christian Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Mahan 
Sr. made a business trip to 
Chattanooga, Oklahoma Monday. 
They were also in Denton 
Wednesday and Thursday on 
business. 

The Maberrys attended the 50th 
wedding anniversary and reception 
for Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Moss of evethng. 
Slidell in the Era  Masonic Lodge 	Mrs. Gladys Balthrop had as 
Sunday, May 2, from 230 to 5:30. her guests for the weekend Mr. and 
Wayne and Margaret (Rodden) Mrs. Garland Lehman and son 
Moss were flurried May 8, 1943 in Tracy and his friend Jimmy of Iowa 
Gainesville. Mr. and Mrs. Moss are Part They also visited Mrs. Anna 
formerly of Leo. They lived in Fort Kirk, David and Becky. 
Worth 40 years and then retired. 	Raymond and Bertha Young of 
Their son and daughter-in-law and Tyler visited Laura Belle and Ted 
four grandchildren of Arlington Jackson Saturday morning. The 
hosted the party. 	 Youngs and Jacksons have been 

longtime friends_ 

FOR RENT 
Muenster Building 

Center, Inc. 
759-2232 

FOR RENT: }tat p-
SOra)r, :5C0? i^1. 1 
=.1,1174: DB= el: NilleaLlfr 

eel 885-4896  
iver Rental 

Caen& 
limmissins 
Egan 

Raul f: 

Ls-Sitire 
11ini-6'aren%se 

736-3127 
NOTICE FOR REST 

404 or 406 

North Main 
Office or Re:.:. 

Phone 759-272.6 I 

FOR MOBILE HOME 
PE NT 

- , • - 
• • 	- 

faFARM AUCTION 
reheated for May 29, Myra, 
Texas a the Ramer Farm. 
Can Bay Ciaami 

Dace14117. Dant ar  
(g17) 759-22_12. Muermiar. 
Cionny-Fiseadme stet 
Call war_ 

1•. 
mes 

Beginning April 15 
Any' Cards of Thanks 
must be swarm by the 
seniir 	Ti"t_iscr 

dra 	_ 	_ • _:e. S5_1) 
WANTED 

PETS 
'A ANTED: A 'rata 6-Er red 

L 	"-6-ray 
pays OL L OLLS.2- r_ars_a 
plan No LOOLry O'lwL Stt 
10011.11y, C. •1•1 -free 1-67-
635-7611. N 1 • .! '.1111 Arenae Atnra  

W. 6654990 	<21-3.a 

A 

WANTED: 75-200 acres 
with/without bone i 
Mama En, Racy Vies 
area. Please of 817-6489103. 
	 4.11-4-E 

LOST! 

APRIL 22! 
Black Lab, 5 months 

QM female. No collar. 
Answers to Tipper.' 
Ha whit tips on feet 
and tail. Call 759-2517 
after 4 pa, weekends 

arsine. 

Carry Fetal) 	steel(es 	

at Garry' 
uogratwatiolu rr Burry 
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Muenster sta(Batik  is proud winner 	
e ZoneLH c from the 

Upper Elmed Soi D
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If you need copies fast.. 
We can furnish Quick, 

Clear Copies from 
almost any original, 
as well as reductions 

t 	or enlargements. 
- MUENSTER 	  

M ENTERPRISE 
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No.1 
Railroad Ties 

Used Power Ps et 
Community 
Lumber Co. 
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G. McBride, M.D. 
Adult & Pediatric Urology 

ncontinence - Treatment of Kidney Stones 
lance • Treatment of Prostate Name 
(patient Vasectomy - Female Urology 

Call For Appointment 
(817) 759-2271 

MI 
;TER MEMORIAL HOSPITAL r, 
Maple, Muenster, Texas 76252 Congratulations 

- "11. 	4.1 

.4- 
r 

4h 

Garry Fetsch (left) receives congratulations from Muenster State Bank Vice President 
Henry Weinzapfel at Garry's farm near Muenster. 

Muenster State Bank is proud to recognize Gary Fetsch, 
winner of the Zone HI conservationist award 

from the Upper Elm-Red Soil and Water Conservation 
District. We appreciate your work and example. 

Muenster 
State Bank 

INK Rom LENDER 
201 N. Ma.n, Muenster, 759-2257 

All Local 

Cattle 

The One 

Brand Kind 

GAINESVILIrC MARKET, INC. 
SPECIAL REPLACEMENT FEMALE SALE 

Wednesday, May 19, 1993 Gainesville, Texas 
1:00 p.m. 

SELLING 700 FEMALES 
80 Spring Calving First Calf Cross-bnd Heif n. All have calves y Limousin bulls. Pasture exposed back to same bulls. 
200 Brahman Cross Cows, 5 years old and you ger. Calves by Simmental bull. All one brand. 
40 Brangus Baldin, 4 years old with 400 lb. calves at side. Bred ba k to Limousin bulls. All one brand. 
90 Fancy Brangus Heifers bred to Brangus bulls. Start calving Sept miser 1. All one raising. 
52 Brangus Heifers, 25 calves at side, 50 more by sale time. 30 day on the balance. 
70 Brangus 3-year old Cows that already have calves, Brangus calves on side will weigh 200 lbs. Exposed back to Brangus 

bulls since Febtuary  2. 
30 Hereford Cows with Brahman cross calves on side. Gray Brahman bull put back on January 1. These will be 	All cows 

4-5 yrs. old 
15 Hereford Cows with calves out ct Sinunental and Brangus bulls. Simmental bulls put back on cows May I. 
30 Brahman Cross Con, Brangus x Sinunental calves at side, exposed back April I. 
80 Head of Crossbred Cows consisting of Braagus baldies, Tiger Stripes, and Straight Brenta Calves at side one month old on 

all 80 cows. 
20 Old. Cross Cows, 8 calves al side, balance heavy springers. These are straight 4 year olds. 
12 Crossbred Cows, with Litnousin calves, pasture exposed back to Jimmy bulls. These will be 3-years-old first calf heifers. 
40 Head consisting at Brangus baldies, Charbrays, and over 12 Brahmousin. All four years old. All calves are Simmental, exposed 

back to Si mmenual bulls. 
3 	Limousin Bulls and 4 Sinunental Bulls, all two years old. NICE!!! 

All local cattle, of ranches within 60 miles of Gainesville 
Consignments Still Open 

GAINESVILLE IrMAIIICET, INC. 
1920 Refinery Road 

"North Texas' Leading Auction Sale" 

P.O. Box 1055 	Gainesville, Texas 76240 

(817) 665-4367 (817) 665-4999 5-7-I-E 

•• 	—07 	 r  
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Perry calls decision in 
dairy case an ag victory 

I-Farm & Ranch County Agent's Report 
by Craig Rosenbaum 

Dairy Field Day set for 
May 13 in Pickton 
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Pickton. The Jack Kempenaar 
family own and operate a 600-cow 
dairy with an exemplary waste-
handling system. Dairy wastes from 
the lots and milking parlor are first 
flushed into large concrete basins 
where solids can settle out. Liquids 
drain from the solid-waste settling 
basins into lagoons. The 
Kempenaars use the liquid lagoon 
waste to irrigate a variety of crops, 
including coastal bermudagrass, 
ryegrass, rye, wheat and sorghum. 

The tour will feature a free lunch, 
courtesy of commercial exhibitors. 
Dr. Joe Johnson, University of 
Georgia dairy expert, will speak on 
Recycling Dairy Wastes. 

16 The annual Southwest Dairy 
Field Day will be held at Pickton, 
Texas on Thursday, May 13. One of 
the themes this year will be cost- 

spfficient, environmentally-safe 
methods of fertilizing pasture and 
bay with dairy cow waste. The 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service has planned tours of free-
stall housing, intensive grazing 
operations and replacement heifer 
management. A tour of Southwest 
Dairy Museum at Sulphur Springs 
and body scoring demorystrations 
are also on the program. 

The May 13 tour will start at 9 
a.m. on the Kempenaar Dairy, 
located five miles northwest of 

10 
11  SALE; 7 

1:010,lit).4FL b;Pdirece  Yeast  

4.71.4  

Agriculture Commissioner Rick 
Perry declared a victory for 
agriculture recently with the Texas 
Supreme Court's decision in the 
case of FIR Cattle Company. Inc. 
vs. State of Texas. The case centers 
around whether naturally produced 
odors, such as those of a cattle 
feedlot, fall within the Texas Clean 
Air Act 

"This decision is a victory for 
agriculture because it brings 
common sense back into the 
decision-making process," Perry 
said. "The Supreme Court's ruling 
says that the normal and usual 
activities of an area can be taken 
into account. In this case, Erath 
County is a large dairy producing 
area; therefore, a dairy feedlot is not 
out of context, but a dairy feedlot in 
downtown Houston would be 
another matter entirely." 

In February, TDA filed with the 
Supreme Court a 'friend of the court' 
brief in support of F/R Cattle 
Company. Perry contended that the 
Eastland Court of Appeals' decision, 
which bad wide implications for 
other agricultural production 

facilities, was unreasonable and 
should not be allowed to stand. 

In a 7-2 decision, the Supreme 
Court reversed the judgment of the 
Court of Appeals, and ordered the 
case back to the appellate court for 
further review and action consistent 
with the Supreme Court's ruling. In 
ruling against the Air Control 
Board's position, the Supreme Court 
adopted the holdings of past cases 
that location is a factor to be 
considered in determining whether 
a pollutant was produced by natural 
processes. 

The Texas Air Control Board 
brought suit against the F/F calf-
raising operation in 1991 on the 
grounds that odors from the calf-
raising facility violated the Texas 
Clean Air Act by releasing air 
contaminants without a permit The 
266th District Court in Erath 
County found that the odors were 
naturally produced, normal and 
usual for the area. Therefore, it held 
that F/R was not subject to the 

Texas Clean Air Act. That decision 
was later reversed by the Eastland 
Court of Appeals. North Texas 

Communications 
Company 

Peach Leaf Curl 
This year, homeowners have seen 

a large infestation of a fungal 
disease called Peach Leaf Curl in 
their home orchards. 

The Peach Leaf Curl fungus is 
found in all areas. It affects leaves, 
flowers, tender shoots and fruits. 
Infected leaves are characterized by 
puckering, thickening and curling. 
Diseased leaves become pale yellow 
to light green and shed after a short 
time. On young twigs, the disease 
appears as small, seldom-noticed 
swellings. Fruit and blossoms shed 
when infected and are seldom 
observed by growers. Disease 
development is related to air 
temperature at the time buds are 
opening. If surface moisture is 
present and the air temperature is 
near 68 degrees F., infection can 
take place. Temperatures above 86 
degrees F. and below 40 degrees F. 
inhibit the fungus. If surface 
moisture is not present, then 
infection does not take place. After 
the disease is visible, control is 
impossible. Copper fungicide sprays 
applied at the beginning of 
dormancy have proven very 
satisfactory. Chlorothalonil can also 
be used at leaf shed and just prior to 
bud break. From My  

Side of the Fence  

Cool Season Forage Tour 
A Cool Season Forage Tour will 

be held Tuesday, May 11, beginning 
at 9:30 a.m. First stop on the tour 
will be the Fuhrmann Brothers 
Limousin Farm. Fuhnnann Brothers 
has planted plots containing 
Fungus-Free Fescue and Jose Tall 
Wheatgrass. In addition, the new 
Texas Bluegrass was planted. All of 
these cool season perennials were 
planted in the fall of 1992. 
Observations will be made as to 
growth and establishment methods 
and characteristics. 

The Fuhnnann Brothers plots are 
located approximately four miles 
north of Lindsay on FM 1199. 

Second stop on the tour will be at 
11 a.m. at the Ryegrass Variety 
Demonstration located on the 
Thurman Ward Farm at Sivells 
Bend. This plot is located on 
County Road 408 approximately 112 
mile west of the Sivells Bend 
Church. At the location, the 
Ryegrass Varieties Marshall, TAM 
90, Gulf and Tetragold were 
planted. Forage clippings have been 
taken for the past two months and 
data as to tonnage and regrowth will 
be discussed. In addition, results of 
the demonstration on the Hugh 
Porter Farm concerning sod seeded 
ryegrass and wheat will also be 
reviewed. Producers are invited to 
attend. 
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then was how he was to break his 
son from eating up the profits. After 
discussing it with several of his old 
cronies who spent many bad 
weather afternoons playing 
dominoes in the rear of the store, 
they came up with a plan, and had 
only to wait for the proper time to 
put it into action. 

One evening just as the lad 
entered the store, Mr. Williams 
spoke up loud and clear, "Here he is 
now. He'll prove it to you in a 
minute." When the boy asked what 
be was to prove, Mr. Williams 
showed him a very large oyster he 
bad placed in a cup sitting atop the 
keg, and explained he had a two-bit 
bet with each of three old men at the 
domino table, that the boy would 
swallow the large oyster whole, no 
problem. 

Well, the boy did just that, and 
then told his father to collect his 
bets. Just then one of the "losers" 
turned, drew back his head a bit, 
pursed his lips and sent a spurt of 
tobacco juice unerringly into a brass 
spittoon five or six feet away. He 
then said, "Sonny, if you hadn't 
done that right in front of me, I 
wouldn't believe it. Every one of us 
tried to swallow that bugger, but 
couldn't get 'er down." 

The next sound was that of the 
rear door slamming shut as the 
young man made a hasty exit. 

by Ed Cler 
A man named Williams, whose 

first name I can't remember, mostly 
because I never called him anything 
but Mr. Williams, was an old friend 
I learned to know and like, while 
living in Garland, Texas, in the '40s. 

In many conversations we had 
from time to time, he related several 
stories I remember well. One such 
tale was about some of the things 
that happened while he was the 
owner/operator of a "general store" 
a few miles out of Garland. 

Mr. Williams sold a variety of 
products, both groceries and durable 
goods, and it was not at all unusual 
for him to have a keg of raw oysters 
sitting on the counter, for sale, or at 
least it was his intention to sell 
them. The only problem was he had 
a high-school-age son who dearly 
loved to swallow quite a number of 
the delicacies whole each evening 
after school, while he did some 
chores at the store, so there was 
little or no profit in the oyster 
business. 

The problem Mr. Williams had' 

We congratulate the 

1992 Upper Elm-Red Soil 

Conservation District 

• Purchase requires Basic or Associate Plan 

Come See What Special Deals We Have For You! 

North Texas 
Communications Company 

2200 East Highway 82 	 Gainesville, Texas 
665-3347 or 736-2251 

Horse Show 
Playday untry by  itidEihngs 

Ruth 

3/4-Ton & 1-Ton Dodge Trucks 

Let us give your farm and 
ranch a powerful boost 

with a hard working Dodge 
truck equipped with a 

Cummins Turbo Diesel. 

6 Johnson Motor Coll4ei 
Dodge Trucks 300 N. Interstate 35 

Gainesville 665-3461 
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The Clay County 4-H Horse Club 
is sponsoring an Open Youth Horse 
Show Playday and Roping 
Saturday, May 8, at the Ellis Arena 
in Henrietta. Plaques will be 
awarded for first place with second 
through sixth given ribbons. 

Also, trophies will be given to 
high point winner in each age group 
and county challenge winner. 

For more information, call 
Connie Ellis, 817-538-5561. 
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C 
SHURFRESH 

SIRLOIN STEAK. ie $369 	HOT 

T-BONE STEAK 	,B.$469  DOGS 

4" 79 C 
2.0z. PORTERHOUSE 	Le. 	 PKG, 

FISCHER'S HOT OR REG. 

FISCHER'S GRAIN FED BEEF 

LEAN TRIM FRESH 

PORK STEAK 

LB '1" 
GREAT FOR CHICKEN !ATM 

CUBE STEAK 	LEAN BEEF CUBES BONELESS 

LB s339 

OSCAR 

BACON 	I LB PH $119 

OSCAR MAYER REG. OR WIDESSERT 

LUNCHABLES. 4.6 OZ., BUY GET FREE! 

MAXIMUM OR EXTRA STRENGTH 

SINUTAB 	24.CT. TABLETS:CAPLETS 
18 3 9 9 

WHITE RAIN HAIR SPRAY:SKI/I LOTIONICONDITIONERI 

SHAMPOO 	each $ 1 
29 

ASSORTED DEODORANT 

RIGHT GUARD 	110 Ot SIZE $ 2 9 9  

BREAKFAST SAUSAGE LB '179  
SELECT SLICED 

BEEF LIVER 	LB 59' 
SHURFRESH ASSORTED 

LUNCH MEATS 	,202 INC 99' 
PRICE'S PIMIENTO OR JALAPENO 

CHEESE SPREAD.. isoz SIZE $109 

STEW MEAT LB. $ 2 5 9  

F ischerhaus 
1:)ctify kunck $.peciaCs 

,May 10 - jaryeno Chicken 

)V(ay 11- Charcoalecbqriffei,Pork Ckcys 
)14ay 12 - $uttermia ,Pecan Chicken reasts 
Wtay 13 - eef ,Strosanoff Cver Noodles 

Wlay 14 - ,Enchilncia Dinner 

„May 15 - n3 ,Ranch Casserole 

L 

LITE OR 

ASSORTED DEODORANT 

SOFT & DRI 	8.02, SIZE $299 

IB 01 $ 2 4 9  

LIPTON ASSORTED 

NOODLES & SAUCE 	99' 

OIL MONTE MIXED FRUIT OR 

PEACH CUPS 	PIM *1 89  
RFD OR LONG DRAIN 

COMET RICE 	.099' 
PRICE SAVER 

SUGAR 	...... ALR RAG $ 139 
 

PILLSBURY FLOUR. 0.11. BAG $ 1 2 9  

BETTY CROCKER ASSORTED 

CAKE MIXES :EXCL. ANGEL FOOD). 99' 
SHURFINE CHUNK 

TUNA IN WATER ONLY 	11  6 D2 2 Foa 9 
MAZOLA OIL 	4802 2 1 9  

	

r 	 

2 

L 	 

REG. $1.49 79 

LAY'S KRAFT SELECT MILD CHEDDAR OR 
COLBY CHEESE 	B02 PRO $ 1 59  
KRAFT SLICED DELUXE 

AMERICAN CHEESE 12 00 $229 
SUNNY DELIGHT ASSORTED 

CITRUS PUNCH 	010Z. ISTL. 99'  
STOVE TOP TURKEY 

STUFFING MIX 	B og. $ 1 "  

WEIJSKE WYROBY DILL OUARTERSIHOTIVIHOLE 

POLISH PICKLES 	32oz. $ 169 
PRICE SAVER 

MAXWELL HOUSE ASSORTED (EXCL. DECAF 	1 

COFFEE 	 130: $189 

DEL MONTE CATSUP32 oz 8 1" 

BLEACH 	1 ULM 
11 
so 1.

II  
/ 

WITH IN AD COUPON 

	  CHERRIES 	Boz. 69' 
SHURFINE RED MARASCHINO SHURFINE WHIPPED 

TOPPING 	 ,202.99! 

111, 

SPECIAL K FLAKES 

110 

HUNT'S ASSORTED REG.ILIGHT SNACK PACK 

	"1 	PUDDING 	4 CT., 50Z. PKG. 99' 

AMERICAN BEAUTY ELBO RONI, LONG OR THIN 

SPAGHETTI 	24.0Z, PKG $ 1 39 

VIVA TOWELS 	BIG ROLL '1" 

LEVER 2000 SOAP 

120Z., WITH COUPON 
1st ONE AT 51 .99 EACH, OTHERS '4.49 EACH 

KELLOGG'S 

*1" 

$ 1 99 2.BAR PK 

SNE 

i3WH PKIN 

GEBHARDT S 

PLAIN CHILI 	19 02 $109  
FailliEEN BEANS LB 99' 

• 

*2"  1002.  

SURE SAVE CUT FRENCH FRIED 

POTATOES 	2 LB BAG 69° 

PATIO ASSORTED 

BURRITOS 	50Z. PKG. 3 FOR $ 100 

ASSORTED 

ENTREES 

NICE 'n SOFT WHITE OR ASSORTED 

BATH TISSUE 

4 ROLL PKG. 79' 

GOLDEN ROYAL REGULAR 

HOMO. MILK 
$ 188  1 GALLON 

$ 1 " 9114.00.9DX 

DOLE FRESH 

COLE SLAW MIX., LB BAG 89' 

":\'k 
FRESH TROPICAL 

PINEAPPLE. EACH $169 

APPLES 

WASHINGTON REO OR GOLDEN DELICIOUS 

3 LB. BAG $1
19 

Pi;CIE6mitirfeiAucE 	 8179 POTATO CHIPS 

(  Good Through: May 19, 1993)  lietv 

Save 85c- 
on gliE 12 oz. ONLY. 

00,11Mth MOO larll....1.111. 

	

1111.101 	141.0.... 
mm••••• 

.."" • alt.04.....11111•171 elm Y.n000 	ri=()." 
Good only yl THRIFTWAY. LA 71E110A (EXCLUDING ODESSA) 

N.X41 
V;IIMIf'aD00  

ALL TYPES LAY'S.  

Potato Chips 
REG. 51 .49 SIZE 790 

N 

z 

NEW CROP SUPER SELECT 

CUCUMBERS.co 39'  

LARGE STALE 

CELERY 	EACH 59'  
NEW CROP VALENCIA 

ORANGES 4 LB BAG $ 1 1 9  

POTATOES

NEW RED 

L. 39'  

SENIOR CITIZENS • No Amount of Purchase 
• Limited Sale Items! 

QUANTITY RIGHTS 
RESERVED 

AFFILIATED 

ALL ITEMS NOT 
AVAILABLE AT ALL 

AFFILIATED STORES 

Prices Effective 

May 10 through May 15 

Nthrilre,9 iiirttt filarkrt 
304 N Main, Muenster Since 1927 	1 (800)-535-7248 or 759-4211 

DOUBLE COUPONS EVERY DAY! 
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MUENSTER 
Serving Muenster 

and Cooke County since 1936 ENTERPRISE 
UPPER ELM-RED SOIL AND WATER CONSERVATION 

DISTRICT ANNUAL AWARDS ISSUE 

1 
One year later, 
progress can 
be measured 

THE GROWTH of 500 black locust trees 
planted in April 1992 on the Henry Weinzapfel 
Ranch north of Muenster progresses. The "stick" 
seedlings were put in place by USDA Soil 
Conservation workers (at left), including Richard 
Connell (plaid shirt) and Sandy Heaton (striped 
shirt) of the Cooke County SCS staff. Below, the 
black locusts surround the gully. Their fibrous root 
system should help prevent future erosion, 
allowing growth to help "dam up" the washed 
area 

Sank Hartman Photo 
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Soil and Water Conservation 
means a lot to your future. 

It means a lot to ours, too! 
CONGRATULATIONS 

to the Zone and Special Award Winners 

We appreciate your business. 

Highway 82 West 	
759-4628 MUENSTER 

Gainesville, Texas 
665-34570 GAINESVILLE 

Enderb 

Congratulations 
to the Winners of the Upper 

Elm-Red Soil Conservation District 

11.1 

We thank you for the improvement 

and preservation of our land. 

Our land is the future. 

Bezner Insurance 
representing 

GERMANIA INSURANCE L.C. 163 

Skipper-Joe-JoAnn 
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Ernest Melton named Zone V 
Outstanding Conservationist 

ERNEST MELTON 
ZONE V OUTSTANDING CONSERVATIONIST 

carried out on this acreage. Ernest 
has been very active in helping 
young people with 4-H projects 
through the years. He hopes to 
educate further generations of the 
need for conservation. 

Ernest is a member of the 
Choctaw Watershed Board of 
Directors. He was selected to fill 
Bill Youree's unexpired term. 

Ernest said, "1 thought when I 
retired from IBM after 31 years, 1 
would rest, but it seems there is 
always something to do." Ernest has 
proven through the years he is a 
"doer" on his land and an excellent 
public servant. 

The Upper Elm-Red SWCD is 
proud to recognize Ernest for his 
ongoing efforts to conserve natural 
resources. 

The Upper Elm-Red Soil and 
Water Conservation District is 
proud to name Ernest Melton as the 
Zone 	V 	Outstanding 
Conservationist for 1992. Zone V 
covers all of Grayson County and is 
represented by Board Chairman 
Clyde Hale. 

Ernest and his wife, Helen, reside 
on their 250-acre farm east of 
Sherman. They have lived there 
since 1959, where they raised their 
three sons Steve, Bruce and Collin. 
In addition to his own farm, Ernest 
also operates his father-in-law's 
place and that of an adjoining 
neighbor. He farms over 450 acres. 

Ernest became a district 
cooperator in 1961, realizing he 
needed all the assistance he could 
get to help him bring his land up to 

its potential. Ernest has cleared and 
sprigged over 15 acres of heavy 
brush, constructed three ponds, 
shaped and sprigged 15 acres of 
critically eroding gullies, 
constructed 575 feet of diversion 
terraces, and sprigged 200 acres of 
bennudagrass. Grass lands are 
cross-fenced in order to enable him 
to rotate grazing and cut hay from 
the acreage. Ernest uses Limousin 
bulls with his mixed breed cow 
herd. He recently purchased a black 
Polled Limousin bull to place with 
his replacement heifer herd. 

Ernest uses a no-till type drill to 
overseed his pastures with rye, 
wheat, oats and vetch. This 
furnishes excellent grazing while 
his bermudagrass is dormant. An 
extensive fertilization program is 

Meet the SWCD Board 
James K. 'Rooter" Brae Jr. has 

represented Zone I of the Upper 
Elm-Red SWCD for the past 13 
years, nine of these as Vice-
Chairman of the District's Board of 
Directors. 

In addition to his contributions to 
the local district, he is active in the 
North Central Texas Association of 
Soil and Water Conservation 
Districts, serving as president in 
1990. 

since 1985. He has lived in 
Montague County all of his life and 
has been actively involved in 
farming and ranching since 1971. 
For the past 18 yeas, he has owned 
and operated Farmer's Creek Dairy. 
Henry has been an active 
conservationist for many years. He 
was named Outstanding 
Conservationist for Zone I in 1982 
by the SWCD, Farmer of the Year 
in 1983 by the Bowie Chamber of 
Commerce, and Agribusinessman of 
the Year by the Nocona Chamber of 
Commerce in 1991. In addition to 
serving -as a director of the Upper 
Elm-Red SWCD, Henry also serves 
on the Farmer's Creek Watershed 
Authority Board of Directors and 
the Farmer's Home Administration 
Board. He, his wife Phyllis and sons 
Reece and Todd live on their farm 
four miles southeast of Nocona. 

"Rooter" is a graduate of the 
Texas Christian University Ranch 
Management Program and has been 
actively involved in ranching in 
Montague County since 1970. He, 
his wife Lynda and son J.K. live on 
their ranch south of Bowie. 

Henry Berry has been Zone II 
director for the Upper Elm-Red Soil 
and Water Conservation District 

A TRADITION OF 
COMMITMENT 

TO DISTINCTIVE SERVICE 
Thanks to the 

Soil Conservation Service 
and all those who work to conserve 

Soil and Water! 

Community LumbeeCo. 
Highway 82, Muenster, 759-2248 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

        

Rudy Zumnerer was appointed as 
the Upper Elm-Red Soil and Water 
Conservation District's director for 
Lone III in the fall of 1989. 

Zimmerer directs a 1500-acre 
wheat, hay and cow-calf operation 
southwest of Lindsay in Cooke 
County. He graduated from Lindsay 
High School and then attended 
Cooke County College before 
receiving a degree in Education 
from North Texas State University 
in Denton. Rudy and his wife, 
Claudia, live on the farm with their 
six children. 

William Hermes serves as Zone 
IV director for the Upper Elm-Red 
Soil and Water Conservation 
District. He has been on the board 
of directors since November 1987. 
Prior to this, he served for nine 
years on the three-member Cooke 
County ASCS County Committee. 

Hermes farms small grain, grain 
sorghum and hay crops and runs a 
cow-calf operation near the flood 
community in southwestern Cooke 
County. He and his wife, Mary 
Evelyn, were recognized by the 
SWCD as Outstanding 
Conservationists for their zone in 
1984. They have nine children and 
13 grandchildren. 

Clyde Hale of Sherman is serving 
in his 21st year as director of the 
Upper Elm-Red Soil and Water 
Conservation District. Hale has 
been on the board since 1972 and 
has served as chairman since 1982. 

Hale has served on the 
Association of Texas Soil and 
Water Conservation Districts Board, 
and is presently serving on the 
board of directors of the National 
Association of Conservation 
Districts. This is his second three-
year term. 

I lale and his wife Jimmie work at 
Austin College. He is director of 
sindent loan collections. Clyde was 
in the banking-profession for 23 
years before he was elected on the 
SWCD board. Clyde was the 
founding president of the former 
Texoma National Bank in Sherman. 
Ile is currently running a cow/call 
operation. Clyde and Jimmie have 
three children and eight 
grandchildren. 

ci nE 
rn 0 I-- -nu 

rig sT• 
0 rim= 

— 1 
rn a 

• 

e 

VOL. LVII NO. 24 May 7, 1993 12 PAGES 



We Congratulate You! 
Upper Elm-Red 

Soil Conservation 
Winners 

For a Job Well Done 

thLT,LET Hilz-Snider Gee 
1405 N. Stemmons Metro 430-091. Sanger 	456-7431 

We Salute Conservation 
Efforts of This Area 

We're available to serve 
farmers and ranchers 

for all their repair needs. 

drefe• 
Hydraulic hoses 

made while you wait. 

Muenster Auto Parts 
and Muffler Shop 

330 West Highway 82,759-4487 

We're A Part Of Texas History! 
Since the First State Bank of Gainesville was established in 

1905, we've become a Texas tradition and a part of Texas history. 
We're the oldest state bank in Texas and like any tradition, we will 

continue to be here for you to meet all your banking needs. 
So come in today and become a part of tradition. The First State 
Bank of Gainesville... a smart investment for your future and a 

Texas Tradition. 

The 	Tradition 

Ma" "71:57" flare LAM Cal170ffiLLO 
(817) 665-1711 P.O. Box 10 Gainesville, Texas 76241-0010 

Member 

FDIC 

Soil and Water 
Conservation 
We can help you do the job with 

Hydraulic Hoses, Roller Chains, Sprockets, Steel Bolts, 

Feeders, Trailer Supplies & STEEL for all your needs I 

20' & 40' Storage Containers 

New Reject and Used Tubing 
21116" 2318" 2718" 

Flusche Enterprises, Inc. 
109 S Main (817) 759.2203 Muenster,TX 
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Thanks 
Thanks for your efforts at 

FORD 
TRUCKS 

32 F-Series Pick-ups 
in stock to choose from 

Texas and Oklahoma Farm Bureau Members, TSCRA Members 
and Commercial Customers Can Qualify for a 

$500.00 REBATE 
Please See our Salesmen for Details 

Congratu
lations 	  

to the Upper Elm-Red 

Soil Conservation District Winners! 

If we don't have what you want, 
we can get it in 24 hours. 

Endres Motor Co. 
Hwy. 82 at Main, Muenster, 759-2244 	Call 665-2281 from Gainesville 
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Ellzey picked for SWCD award, Zone I Conservation essays by Newberry,Mahon 
been invented. This system only 
disturbs the immediate area of the 
crop row. The till planter system 
scalps the old crop row, pushing the 
residue aside. Many of the older 
farmers disagree with this method 
because it doesn't go deep enough 
into the soil, preventing good 
aeration. 

Conserving the soil is a vital 

necessity to our country. Our 
nation's food supply will begin to 
decline rapidly if our soils are not 
managed efficiently. If we practice 
conservation by terracing, crop 
rotation, the no-till planter system, 
and many other methods, our efforts 
for conserving the soil will be the 
first step in the survival of our 
country. 

We should stop polluting the 
water. Like the oceans, beaches, 
rivers and lakes. Polluting the water 
is terrible because all its doing is 
killing our animals and making us 
have unhealthy water that could 
make us sick. Also, cola rings that 
people throw in the water. are killing 
our fishes when they put their heads 
through the holes. 

If you want to stop the wasting of 
water, we all are going to have to 
work together. Suddenly, when you 
helped stop wasting soil and water, 
you are going to feel good inside 
because. you helped make your 
community a better environment to 
live in. 

collecting water from a definite area 
of land above it. It has been 
reported that soil losses are six 
times greater from an unterraced 
f eld, than from a terraced field. 
Terraces give the farmer more 
possibilities in planning his 
cropping system. With terraces, the 
entire field can be fanned to a single 
crop. Terraces must be built 
properly and maintained if they are 
to be successful. 

For many years, crop rotations 
have been the standard system for 
helping to conserve the soil. 
Recently, conservationists have 
come to recognize that regular crop 
rotations are not always necessary 
on all soils to maintain good filth or 
structure, make soil take in water, 
and to keep erosion under control. 

New processes and improved 
machinery have come about that can 
help to manage the soil without crop 
rotation. In recent years. a no-till 
planter system of conservation has 

D.L. ELLZEY 
ZONE I OUTSTANDING CONSERVATIONIST 

ANGELA MAHON 
Angela Mahon, whose teachers 

are Mrs. Bailey and Mr. Baker, is a 
freshman at Sherman High School. 
Her parents are James and Sandra 
Mahon. 

3rd Place 
Conserve - For Survival 

Soil Conservation is accepted as a 
way of fanning and ranching in our 
nation today. While millions of 
acres of land are being eroded, 
many of our progressive farmers are 
practicing soil conservation by 
terracing, crop rotation and by using 
the no-till planter system, as well as 
other means. 

Terraces are surface drains or 
channels constructed across the 
slope of rolling land. They are also 
designed to conduct water from the 
field in such a way that erosion is 
kept under control. The long slope 
of the land is broken up into a series 
of shorter ones with the terraces 
being built across the slope, 

CRYSTAL NEWBERRY 
Fifth grader Crystal Newberry 

attends Ben Franklin Elementary in 
Gainesville, with Mrs. Moseley as 
her teacher. Her parents are Annie 
and Carl Newberry. 

2nd Place 
Soli and Water Conservation  
I think soil and water are very 

important natural resources because 
we need them both in life. If we 
want to keep both natural resources 
we are going to have to find a wise 
way of using them. Instead of 
wasting them both. The soil of 
farmlands, grazing lands, and forest 
lands provide many products and 
recreational areas. Soil 
conservationists work to ensure the 
wise use of these soils for both 
present and future needs. 

Wise use of farmlands involves 
maintaining a high level of nutrients 
and organic matter in cultivated 
soils. Farmers add organic matter to 
the soil by plowing under certain 
green plants. They also add 
fertilizers and rotate crops to replace 
nutrients that leaching and growing 
plants remove. In addition, farmers 
plow and plant their fields in ways 
that control erosion. Grazing lands 
that have been overgrazed also 
suffer from erosion. Overgrazing 
decreases the amounts of plant life 
and organic matter in soil. 

So, if you want to live in abetter 
community, you should use less soil 
and try to save soil. Water is 
another very important natural 
resource because we use it to drink, 
take baths, swim in, and also 
animals swim in oceans and, if we 
don't stop polluting the oceans, all 
the poor, harmless animals will be 
killed. 

year round. 
The Upper Elm-Red Soil and 

Water Conservation District 
congratulates Mr. D.L. Ellzey in his 
conservation accomplishments. 

constructed to develop a sound 
grazing management system. 

The difference from the 
conditions of the land in 1988 to 
present are quite dramatic. Dick 
started with severe gully erosion, 
no grass, very little water for 
livestock, no cross fences, and no 
real potential for a cow operation. 
Today the Ellzey farm has 128 
acres of improved coastal bermuda 
and 64 acres of native grass. The 
farm is divided into four pastures 
with water for livestock in each 
pasture. Dick has ample grass and 
the farm is carrying 33 animal units 

Meet D.L. "Dick" Ellzey, 1993 
zone one winner of the Upper am-
Red Soil and Water Conservation 
award. Dick and his wife, Helen, 
are long time Forestburg residents. 
Dick's family came to the 
Forestburg area in 1938 and Helen 
was born in Forestburg. In fact, the 
Ellzey s live in the home Helen was 
born in and Dick's parents later 
lived in. Dick and Helen are both 
retired public school teachers, 
having taught in the state of 
Louisiana for 28 years. In 1988 
they retired and moved back to 
Forestburg. 

In 1989 they purchased their 192 
acre farm located approximately 
four miles west of Forestburg. 
Their farm had several acres of 
severe gully erosion, infestations of 
brush, and a poor stand of native 
grass. 

Dick requested assistance from 
the Soil Conservation Service 
(SCS) located in Montague. SCS 
personnel recommended needed 
conservation improvements and 
Dick made an application for the 
Great Plains Conservation 
assistance program. 

In April of 1991 a Great Plains 
contract was signed by Dick and 
the Upper Elm Red SWCD. The 
plan called for constructing nine 
grade stabilization structures for 
erosion control, one pond for 
livestock water, one diversion 
terrace and seven and one half acres 
of gully shaping. In addition to 
these engineering practices 35 
acres of brush was cleared, 120 
acres of grass was planted, and 
7600 feet of fences were 
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M. & S. DAIRY & FARM CENTER, INC. 
1529 N. DIXON 

GAINESVILLE, TEXAS 76240 
FARM AUTOMATION SPECIALIST 

'Time is Money - Let Us Save You Both' 	. 
Willie Joe Matthews 

OH Ice: (817) 668-7861 	 Res.: (817) 665-6823 

Upper Elm-Red SWCD and 

We Appreciate our Clients' 

Agri-business 

322 North Main 

Muenster, Texas 

(817) 759-2287 

You have done a 
great job in saving 
our Nation's Most 
Important 
Resources— 
The Land. 

We Salute the 

We're here to serve you! 
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When hydraulic hose fails 
in the field you can't 

afford to wait 
We make Gates factory-quality hydraulic assemb- 
lies to your exact specifications in minutes. Get 

hydraulic hose replacements FAST from 

Hennigan 
Auto Parts 

Highway 82. Muenster. 759 2291 

It takes more than optimism! 
The farmer/rancher is an eternal optimist. He must be— 

lo contend with such imponderables as weather, prices 
and costs 

Farm Bureau works for 
agriculture on three broad 

Iv  fronts- 
1. TO INCREASE ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY—

Through effectiveness in Public Affairs (policy 
development & legislative activities) 

2. TO STRENGTHEN FARMERS' COMPETITIVE 
POSITION IN MARKETPLACE—Through 
marketing programs, commodity activities, market 
expansion 

3. TO CONTROL PRODUCTION COSTS—Through group purchasing 
(tires & batteries), insurance protection (fire. life & casualty), group 
insurance (medical care) 

We're Helping the Farmer 

Cooke County Farm Bureau 
Board of Directors 
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Sandmann, Gieb win SWCD essay, poster contests 
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Facts about the Soil 
Conservation Service 

.4. 

A 

UPPER ELM RED-SOIL and WATER CONSERVATION DISTRICT'S DIRECTORS are, I to r, Rudy 
Zinunerer (Zone III), William Hermes (Zone IV) and Clyde Hale (Zone V). Read about all the district's directors 
on page 12. 

iliTonnilini/ZILNatirfairinnlaWeiratVe'sThytretraTtyatt,  

What it is: The Soil Conservation 
Service is an agency of the United 
States Department of Agriculture. 
SCS offices are located in nearly all 
of the nation's 3,000 counties. 
Offices are also located in Puerto 
Rico and the Virgin Islands. 

How it works: SCS works 
directly through and with locally 
governed organizations called soil 
and water conservation districts 
(SWCD's). Districts establish 
priorities for conservation work 
within their boundaries and SCS 
employees provide the technical 
assistance. 

second place, and Angela Mahon 
from Sherman, third place. Second 
and third places in the poster 
contest went to Emmy Schad of 
Valley View and Leah Hermes of 
Lindsay. 

STEPHANIE SANDMANN 
Stephanie Sandmann, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Sandmann of 
Gainesville, is a sophomore at 
Lindsay High School. Stephanie's 
teacher is Mrs. Fleitman. 

1st Place 
Protecting Our Future 

Soil and water are essential for 
the survival of humans and animals. 
If these resources are not protected 
now there will be very little or none 
for the future survival of the world. 

Soil consists mainly of minerals 
mixed with organic matter. A thin 
layer of fertile soil that covers much 
of the earth's land was formed by 
natural processes over thousands of 
years. It is vital for farmers to have 
a substantial layer of top soil that is 

What it is responsible for: The 
SCS is responsible for a variety of 
conservation programs that deal 
with soil and water, wildlife, 
forestry, mining, urban problems 
and more. The backbone of the 
agency's activities is geared toward 
conservation of soil and water. 

Who is eligible to participate: 
Programs and services of the SCS 
are offered to individuals and 
groups on a voluntary basis. All 
programs are available on a 
nondiscriminatory basis without 
regard for race, color, national 
origin, age, sex, religion, marital 
status or handicap. 

CAINESVILIIIr MARKET, INC. Farmers: make your 
move to stay eligible 

many lakes and rivers have been 
destroyed by pollution. Many 
bodies of water have been polluted 
by industries dumping chemicals 
and heavy metal into the water. In 
some areas, there are water 
shortages due to little rainfall and 
pollution. 

In some areas, there have been 
massive clean-up programs started 
to save the water and restore the 
quality of the water. Cities and 
industries can help with pollution by 
taking out harmful substances from 
wastes before emptying the waste 
into the lakes and streams. This is 
expensive and it will take many 
years to clean up the water. In areas 
where there is a shortage of water, 
irrigation and drip systems are used. 
This helps bring water to plants and 
reduces waste. 

Soil and Water Conservation 
Districts were established by the 
federal government in 1939 to 
promote conservation of vital 
resources. The districts are involved 
in educating the public about the 
need for conservation and the 
administration of government-
sponsored conservation programs. 

People need to support the Soil 
and Water Conservation Districts. 
People also need to think about the 
importance of saving these 
resources and practice conservation. 

STEPHANIE SANDMANN STACIE GIEB 

Lindsay sophomore Stephanie 
Sandmann and Stacie Gieb, a sixth 
grader also from Lindsay, are the 
respective winners in the 1993 
essay and poster contests sponsored 
by the Upper Elm-Red Soil and 
Water Conservation District. 

"All students and teachers who 
participated are to be commended 
for their interest in the annual 
contest. A total of 303 students 
entered the essay contest while 152 
entries were received for the poster 
contest", commented SWCD 
chairman Clyde Hale of Sherman. 
The first, second and third place 
finishers in each contest receive a 
cash award. In addition, all students 
who participated in the contests 
received a Red Oak tree seedling 
for their efforts. 

Stephanie is the daughter of 
Donald and Linda Sandmann of 
Lindsay. Stacie is the daughter of 
Louie and Molly Gieb of Lindsay. 
Other essay winners included 
Crystal Newberry of Gainesville, Make a good move for you and benefits. Call the USDA Soil 

your farm. Apply your Farm Bill Conservation Service in Montague, 
conservation plan now to stay Gainesville or Sherman for more 
eligible for USDA farm program information. 

HOW TO CONTACT THE SCS - Montague County: Montague Field 
Office, Star Route Box 4, Montague Texas 76251-9701, phone 817-894-
3401; Cooke County: Gainesville Field Office, Route 2 Box 34-8, 4504A 
West Highway 82, Gainesville, Texas 76240-9744, phone 817-668-7794; 
Grayson County: Sherman Field Office, 406B West Lamar, Sherman, 
Texas 75090-5838, phone 903-892-6013. 

Get the farm facts 
from the 
Muenster 

Enterprise! 

soil. One such program is known as 
Conservation Reserve. This 
program is designed to take highly-
erodible land out of production and 
establish it with a cover crop for a 
period of 10 years. The farmers are 
required to stay in compliance with 
the approved programs to receive 
the government benefits. 

Forests are another vital land 
resource. Timber can be removed in 
various ways to help protect the 
land and other things that are 
dependent on the forest 

Water is essential for residential 
use, agriculture and industry, but 

rich in the vital nutrients needed by 
plants to grow. Humans' practices 
have destroyed the soil in a matter 
of a few years. Many steps have 
been taken to help prevent this from 
becoming worse. 

To reduce erosion, farmers often 
use strip cropping, in which 
different types of crops are planted 
in alternate strips. This cuts down 
on water run off. Some farmers also 
build terraces with plant.; growing 
on them. These terraces catch the 
water and prevent erosion. Many 
farmers are in programs set up by 
the government to help protect the 

Thank You. • III 
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Bothsalesstart at 10:00a.m. 

for your patronage and your trust in our 
livestock business. We will continue to strive for 
topnotch treatment for our customers, handling 
your sale with your profit in mind. 

.41 
Tuesday-SHEEP, GOAT and HOG SALE 

Friday-CATTLE SALE 

GAINESVILLE inn  ocx MARKET, INC. 
"North Texas' Leading Auction Sale" 

1920 Refinery Road,Gainesville,(817)665-4367 
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The stewardship of the land is 
entrusted from the Lord's hands 

to ours. 
Joe Walter Lumber Co. 

705 Summit Avenue, Gainesville, 685.5577 
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Our economy is 
boosted and our lives improved 

by proper care 
of our land and water. 

Keep up the GOOD WORK! 

Cooke County Abstract 
& Title Company 
107 N. Dixon, Gainesville, 665-3942 

We build the 
unusual ... 
using steel 

STRUCTURES, INC. 
817.759-2714 
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Butcher, Texas Ostrich I laiehery 

Thitrks0 TRUCKS 
715 E. Division (Hwy. 82) 	Muenster 

The Goodyear DT 710 	 (817) 759-4695 
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A Tractor Tire Built For 
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Speed. There's Never Been A Tire That 
di Worked This Fast. In Both Tilled And b 

Unfilled Fields. 
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A(/ Congratulations and Thanks 
to the Soil and Water Conservationists of this Area 
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PRESCHERS 

GAINESVILLE SCS STAFF SERVES COOKE COUNTY - The 
USDA Soil Conservation Service staff in Gainesville includes, I to r, 
Richard Connett, district conservationist; Sandra Heaton, soil 
conservationist; and Clifford Peacock, soil conservation technician. In 
August 1989, Connett moved to the district conservationist'spos. ; non Act 
serving for two years at the Denton field office. Prior to this, lie worked 
for the Service In Pearsall and Hallcusville. Ile ton hansrer red 10 
Gainesville in 1991, coming from the Victoria field ol iiie where she 
began her career in 1989. Peacock reported to Gainesville last month to 
work three days a week as the technician. He is currently a student at 
Southeastern Oklahoma Slate University in Durant, Mbomou I le has 
a so worked for the SCS at the Sherman field office. 

iiiTTtitalaaaat 1P.14 ITL•rif;e1, 
Conservation Service (S('s) 
on-site evaluations of the land 
With input from the Thweatts, 
alternative treatment measures were 
discussed. A conservation plan was 
developed to address each of the 
resource needs of the ranch. The 
Thweatt's utilized the Great Plains 
Conservation Program offered 
through the SCS to assist in 
implu meriting the conservation 
plan 

In 1990, work began to restore 
all of the poor condition land to 
Mond quality, perennial grasses. 

WE 
SALUTE 
YOU! ea-A, 

kInsure Our lurid 
nigh Soil rid 
iinsvisa non 
prat tuts 

One 3X are pasture was planted to 
coastal bermudagrass. This 
improved pasture provides spring, 
summer, and fall grazing. Three 
more pastures totaling 112 acres 
were seeded to a mixture of native 
range grasses. The native grass 
pastures provide high quality forage 
in the summer and a standing hay 
crop in the winter. The good grass 
cover has made a significant impact 
on reducing soil erosion by slowing 
runoff and allowing the soil to 
absorb rainfall more efficiently. 

In addition to reducing erosion, 
the grasses have allowed the same 
land to carry more than twice the 
number of mile as it did prior to 

FMW 11; 

! Independent 
MAYO 
Agent, 

INSURANCE AGENCY 
For ell your insurance needs 

Drawer 0,204 N. Main, Muenster 
Texas, 817 759 4844 

Upper Elm-Red 
Soil & Water 
Conservation 

District 

Continued from Page 8 

Preschers immediately set about to 
recover this land. Pete says, "I 
bossed, Raymond ran the dozer and 
David picked up sticks." 

In addition to the brush clearing, 
the Preachers sprigged coastal 
bermudagrass, constructed stock 
tanks which enabled them to cross 
fence and set up a grazing plan. 
Previously, the 197 acres could only 
run 8 pairs under the brushy 
conditions. I oday, the same 197 
acres carries 71 pairs and has 

fete's 

forape to produce enough 
13,1y to teed tic the (Attire winter. In 
addiiimii 	lIcelnunder Cattle, 

's linnet's also included hog 
farming and a I sh hatchery. 

Lairs. l'cie purchased 80 
addition:1i :Ric% near Callisburg 

his land, although in pastureland, 
had been overikei mit neglet red lug 
many years. 1 he 1st..tilli r 	e  sfitsakt:rials.itsIsl 
some brush, eslahl111i  
and fertilized and inaniged Ihe 
existing grass plus consow. led cross 

leilkI.c.t‘e has since retired, selling 
inosi ill his holJinps lit his sons, 
Raymond. I lint 
mails know, I.Ii turn andp  ii.it. h1;iicres 
11 C 	1 	111110 	1111 	SIIII 
1C‘111 curt 	l'CIC 	11.1 1, 1C1.1111C11 the 
ris .1t 	.11 IIIS hour .11111 11111S IS 
IMO% 01 tegittep El Ili limitteit Ile 
also raises sheep, dill Lens and now 
bees. Pete and Ago.s also began a 
small orchard of peaches, apples 
and grapes. 

Pete is pleased with the 
accomplishments on the land he has 
owned and credits much of the 
success to his family. Pen says, "It 
take* a lot of hard woi k ;tad money 
10 improve the land hilt we 11.0 111C 
dairy to support us and the tios lit 
do the work." I'de's none life has 
been devoted to the land and the 
Upper Fliti Red NWLI/ 
ree0g1d/C 111111101 a lifetime tit toil 
and water conservation. 
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The Upper Elm-Red Soil and 
Water Conservation District 
(SWCD) is pleased to announce 
Earl and Betty Thweatt as this 
year's Zone II Outstanding 
Conservationist Award recipients. 
Zone H of the District covers the 
northern half of Montague County. 
The Thweatts will be recognized al 
the annual awards banquet which 
will be held Thursday, May 6th at 
the Grayson County Airport in 
Sherman. 

The Thweatts are being 
commended for their outstanding 
efforts in soil and water 
conservation on their 200 acre 
ranch nail] of Saint Jo. 

The ranch has been in Mrs. 
Thweatt's family for 55 years. It 
was used for growing crops such as 
corn and sorghum for many years. 
Ova time, several large gullies 
formed along a creek that runs 
through the ranch. These gullies 
threatened to destroy the best land 
on the ranch. The old cropland 
fields had been abandoned and bad 
little or no cover to protect the 
sandy cross-timbers soils. 

At the time the Thweatts moved 
back onto the ranch in 1972, the 
entire 200 acres would only support 
12 head of cattle and that only with 
supplemental feeding. Seeing the 
need to control erosion and 
improve production, the ThsgemUs 
decided to undertake steps to 
restore their land. 

One of their first steps was to get 
technical assistance from the Upper 
Elm-Red SWCD. The Soil 

Family ranch renewed, wins Zone II 

4 
BETTY and EARL II WEATT 

ZONE II (U 	A NDING CONSERVATIONISTS 

• 

being planted. The Thwcatts have a 
growing herd of Angus/I lereford 
crossbred cattle. Currently they run 
about 30 head of mother cows and 
heifers. The cattle are grouped into 
one herd and "rotated" through 4 
pastures. Rotational grazing allows 
each pasture to receive rest from 
grazing for a specified time. It is 
anticipated that stocking rates can 
be increased as the grass stand 
improves. 

In order to achieve proper use of 
the planted grasses, the Thweatts 

Auld, Ilona., 1 Ire 
earl, 

11r:11111 411111 	and Bonding Insurance a•• 

installed cross-fences, drilled a 
water well, and put in a large 
watering trough. 

A system of earthen diversions 
and waterways was constructed to 
divert and carry excess runoff water 
away from critically eroding areas 
and gullies. Three grade 
stabilization structures were built to 
catch and safely release this runoff 
through pipe outlets. Plans are to 
stock these structures with channel 
catfish and fathead minnows fig 

Continued on next page 

Muenster State Bank salutes the 
conservationists of this area who 
con! i uue to care for our natural 
resources. Congratulations to the 
zone winners who are honored at 
I his year's Awards Banquet, 

■ Muenster 
State Bank 

201 N. Islain, kluenster,  , 

759-22S1, 
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This Land is 

OUR Land 

... Let's Cherish It! 

We Salute the Upper Elm-Red 
Soil Conservation District 

Muenster Livestock Auction 
SALE EVERY THURSDAY 

Muenster, Texas 	 817-759-2201 
Bill Hamer 
759-4421 

Mike Hamer 
6654575 

Walterscheid 
Oil Co. 

Muenster, 759 2737 
Let us help you with your 
ges,dlesel end oil needs 

Preserving natural resources — 
preserving a way of life. 

We salute the Upper Elm-Red Soil and Water 
Conservation District for over 50 years of service to 

area farmers and ranchers 

Conserving soil and water endows our 
descendants with the opportunity to prosper 
in agricultural production and enjoy a rural 

way of life. 

Cooke County Electric Cooperative is dedicated to 
making rural lifestyle all they can be by delivering 
reliable electric power at the lowest cost possible. 

Let's use resources wisely to enhance and preserve our way of life. 

fi
COOKE COUNTY 
ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE 
DRAWER 530. MUENSTER, TEXAS 76252 • PHONE (617)759 2211 

Vc.:::::eaz_‘m.vallb  yarn VaSVMS%-t!‘ 

sr‘k  

JACK 
CHEANEY'S 

SADDLE SHOP 
& 

WESTERN WEAR 
211 West Elm 
Gainesville 

665-3361 
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Thank You! 
Farmers 

Ranchers 

Dairymen 

Standing together. 
Standing strong. 

for your 

Patronage 
and Trust 

Red River 
Farm Co-op 

1300 N Duos 665,0336 
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We Congratulate You! 
Upper Elm-Red Soil and Water Conservation District 
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Prescher recognized for conservation in Zone IV 

CONGRATULATIONS 
Upper Elm-Red Soil & Water 

Conservation District 

Peter Prescher of Gainesville has 
been named the Outstanding 
Conservationist for Zone IV of the 
Upper Elm-Red Soil and Water 
Conservation District. He signed a 
conservation agreement in 1965 
with the Upper Elm-Red SWCD at 
which time he developed a 
conservation plan. 

Pete Prescher was born in 
Muenster, Texas 79 years ago. 
When he was 4 years old, his 
parents, six brothers and seven 
sisters moved to Scotland, Texas, 
which is 17 miles south of Wichita 
Falls. Pete married Agnes in 
Scotland 57 years ago. In 1946, they 
purchased 158 acres south of 
Gainesville on what is now 111-35 
where they raised three sons, 
Raymond, Lloyd and David. 

Nearly all of Pete's life has been 
devoted to conservation. Pete can 
remember, as a small boy, his father 
and the County Agent in Scotland 
conducting a seminar at the family 
dairy to introduce a new method of 
farming to control erosion. It was 
called terraces. Most of the local 
farmers laughed at the idea of 
farming such crooked rows. Pete 
recalled that within the next five 
years at least 15 to 20 of those same 
farmers were busy installing 
terraces. 

The Preschers built a dairy on the 
158 acres south of Gainesville and 
began operating with about 40 head 
of registered Holstein cows. Pete 
constructed terraces on the wheat 
field, built cross fences and 
established a grazing plan. These 
practices plus good management 
decisions enabled the dairy to 

on a Job Well Done!  

Muenster Farm Mutual 
Fire Insurance Association 

212 N. Walnut, Muenster, 7594770 

TODD MAREK, Civil Engineer 
for Cooke County's USDA Soil 
Conservation Service, surveys the 
slope of a waterway constructed on 
lay Gribble's land southwest of 
Rosston. The dirt moving continued 
through April of this year, with 
other improvements included on the 
site. 	 Janie Holman Photo 

THWEATTS 

Continued from Page 4 

We salute 
the Soil 

Conservationists 
of 

Our District! 
AGNES and PETE PRESCHER 

ZONE IV OUTSTANDING CONSERVATIONISTS 

Congratulations  

Winners 
of the Upper 
Elm-Red Soil 
Conservation 

District 

See us fur Quality 

Custom 

Meat Processing 

produce enough grazing and hay for 
the 40 head. 

Raymond Prescher, Pete and 
Agnes' oldest son, now owns and 
operates the dairy. Since his 
ownership, he has increased the 
milking numbers from 40 to 
approximately 180 head. He has 
acquired additional land but still 
maintains his father's care for the 
land. I I. „ 	MEAT  605N Muenelar,Texes 	 (617)15927/< 

Pete and Agnes then relocated on 
85 acres northeast of Gainesville on 
County Road 123 in 1968, and 
began a registered Beefmaster cattle 
operation. They had previously 
purchased this 85 acres as well as 
197 acres a few miles east. Both of 
these 	properties 	were 
underdeveloped and had an 
abundance of brush cover. The 

Continued on next page 

future fishing opportunities. 
Most of the native woody 

vegetation along the creeks has 
been saved to provide wildlife 
habitat. Large numbers of deer and 
turkey are seen regularly in these 
areas. Quail are present in the 
grassland adjacent to this woody 
cover. The Thweatts take much 
satisfaction from knowing their 
ranch provides a home for many 
species of wildlife. 

The Thweatts have a strong land 
ethic. Mrs. Thweatt says, "We just 
felt as obligation to leave the land 
in better shape than it was when we 
got it. If each generation would do 
the same we could all take better 
care of the land,” she says. 

Through their conservation 
efforts on the land, the Thweatts 
have become excellent land 
stewards. The Upper Elm-Red Soil 
and Water Conservation District 

   congratulations Earl and Betty 
Thweatt. 

We support your efforts 
in conservation 

and land management. 
and 

We appreciate your business. 
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Thanks for the 
Opportunity 
to Serve the 
Agricultural 
Community 

Schilling Oil 
Company, Inc. 

Gas Oil Diesel Propane 

Muenster, 759.2522 

Congratulations to the Winners 
of the Upper Elm-Red Soil 

Conservation District I,t), 
rah 
 	cI II  
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We thank you for the improvement and preservation 
of our land. Our land is the future. 

North Texas Bank & Trust 
808 E. Hwy. 82 

Member FDIC 
665-8282 Gainesville 

Chevrolet I 
Pontiac 
Buick 

GMC Trucks 

BROWN 

Thank you, conservationists, 
for your efforts to preserve 

the quality of 
our land and water. 

Brown Motor Company, Inc. 
1608 West Hwy. 82, Gainesville 18171665-5591 

0 Gee GMC 
V 

We Salute the 
Farmers and Ranchers 

of Our Area 

Let us support your operations 
with feed, fertilizer and 

custom spreading. 

Tony's Seed and Feed, Inc. 
Muenster and Gainesville 
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Page 6 - May 7, 1993 - Muenster Enterprise SCS Awards Issue Muenster Enterprise SCS Awards Issue - May 7, 1993 - Page 7 

Garry Fetsch honored for efforts in Zone III Wetlands: the freedom and property rights steal 
Muenster native Garry Fetsch has of the Upper Elm-Red Soil and 

been named as the Outstanding Water Conservation District 
Conservationist for 1992 in Zone III (SWCD). 

endangered species and EPA 
regulations can be spelled in three 
words - Recession, Recession, 
Recession! With their destruction 
of jobs and business, enviro-nuts 
and government bureaucrats are 
leading the way to the biggest 
depression the United States and 
the world has ever seen! 

The truth could make you free if 
you inform yourself and then 
others. Speak out for freedom -
your freedom. 

R.A. ''Click" Mader is president of 
Abundant Wildlife Society, Box 639, 
Gilktte, WY 82717, 

plentiful everywhere before the 
white man came have never read 
history of the old expeditions to the 
west where they had to kill and eat 
some of their horses to survive due 
to lack of game. 

With the help of the news media 
and Hitler's technique (that if you 
tell a lie often enough and loud 
enough people will eventually 
believe it) has deceived many who 
support wolf introduction, 
wetlands, the spotted owl, cattle 
free by '93, property rights steal and 
many other far-out deceptions. 

Results of wetlands takings, 

development. Irrigation has 
provided water in areas void of 
water. Return flow made mountain 
streams live streams year around 
instead of drying up in the hot 
summer months. What a benefit for 
fish and wildlife! Return flow also 
created many wetland areas that 
would have never existed 
otherwise. Thousands of miles of 
underground plastic water lines 
have been laid with stock tanks 
along the way, making land useful 
for livestock and wild game that 
was nearly useless before. 

The biggest threat to wildlife and 
freedom is the enviro-nuts and 
politicians who make silly laws 
protecting predators. A classic 
example is the desert tortoise (now 
listed as endangered). Studies 
reveal the reason for the drastic 
reduction of desert tortoises is 
raven predation. Unfortunately, the 
government hasn't the guts to 
reduce the raven population.  
Likewise, the protection and effort 
to bring back the wolf is utter 
nonsense and is about as sensible as 
bringing back smallpox and polio. 

Those who think wild game was 

Currently in his 18th year of 
farming on his own, Garry's 
operation includes five farms in the 
Muenster, Hood and Lindsay areas. 
Ile and his wife, Susan, live on one 
of the places near Muenster along 
with daughters Janet, Kelly and 
Christine. Garry became a 
cooperator with the Upper Elm-Red 
SWCD in 1986 after purchasing a 
farm near Hood in need of 
waterways and terraces. With 
technical assistance from the USDA 
Soil Conservation Service in 
Gainesville, conservation plans 
were developed to address all soil 
and water resource concerns. 

Garry immediately set out to 
protect and improve the farm by 
constructing two waterways and a 
pond. When the bermudagrass 
waterways were established enough 
to handle terrace flow, he 
constructed three miles of parallel 
terraces to help reduce erosion and 
conserve valuable topsoil. Garry 
constructed the waterways and 
terraces himself, using a blade, a 
one-way plow and other 
implements. 
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All five of the Fetsch farms are 
predominantly cropland which is 
managed with a cropping system of 
wheat, oats, milo, corn and forage 
sorghum. All crops produce high 
amounts of residue which Garry 
consistently maintains after harvest 
to protect the soil surface. His 
tillage program keeps the stalks, 
stems and leaves intact on the land 
to intercept raindrops and prevent 
erosion. The residue provides 
adequate cover until the next crop is 
well established and protecting the 
soil. 

CHEVY TRUCKS 
are just right for the 

VALUABLE WORK YOU DO 

Waterway and terrace systems 
are in place on all of the farms to 
help save soil and increase 
productivity. Using the terraces as 
guidelines allows crops to be 
fanned on the contour. Garry carries 
out annual waterway and terrace 
maintenance to keep the structures 
functioning properly. 

In the late '80s, Garry targeted the 
needs of highly erodible cropland 
by developing four new 
conservation plans to comply with 
the conservation provisions of the 
1985 and 1990 Farm Bills. He now 
actively applies the scheduled 
conservation practices in these plans 
to conserve all soil and water 
resources. 

Garry also closely manages the 
grazing on his native grass pastures 
to keep an abundant forage supply 
at all times. Some pastures are 
overseeded to Marshall ryegrass or 
oats to provide cool season grazing. 
In addition, wheat and oat fields 
with low potential for grain 
production are used by livestock for 
grazing. Garry utilizes both a cow-
calf and stocker operation to offer 
the flexibility needed to fit his 
overall system. 

In addition to his daily farm 
work, Garry occasionally does some 
custom hay work and he also owns 
and operates the car wash in 
Lindsay. 

Garry realizes that many of the 
soils on his farms are shallow with 
very little topsoil so he continually 
strives to take care of the land and 
conserve his important soil and 
water resources. The Upper Elm-
Red SWCD is proud to recognize 
him for his ongoing contribution to 
the soil and water conservation. 

by R.A. "Dick" Mader 
Riparian areas and wetlands are 

beneficial for wildlife. However, 
what's happening today with regard 
to riparian areas and wetlands has 
little to do with the preservation of 
wildlife. Rather, it has become a 
tool used to destroy our freedoms 
and to undermine our'constitutional 
rights. 

The wetlands taking of private 
property rights is the greatest theft 
of freedom and property rights ever 
perpetrated! Another success for 
the leftist socialist extremists who 
carry the torch for Karl Man's 
Communist Manifesto which said 
private property rights must be 
destroyed. The Wetlands taking of 
property rights , without just 
compensation is without question 
an outright theft of freedom. Read 
Article V of Bill of Rights of 
United States Constitution "... nor 
deprived of life, liberty or property 
without due process of law; nor 
shall private property be taken for 
public use without just 
compensation." 

As one who lived in the west 
through the Great Dust Bowl 
Depression, I can't believe the 
deception in Wetlands takings. 
Before 1937, the western range 
country was mainly watered 
naturally. Dams and reservoirs 
were all but non-existent. Water 
holes in many areas were very 
scarce and miles apart. Dams that 
existed were built with horses and 
on the whole were small and went 
dry. A few decent dams were built 
by WPA with horses in the 1930s. 

In 1937, the govern rent started a 
program assisting ranchers in 
building dams, drilling wells and 
developing springs. This also was 
the time when we left the horse and 
buggy and went to the mechanized 
power which could move dirt much 
faster. Since that time, millions of 
dams were built offering wildlife 
and fowl the opportunity to 
flourish. Of course, in those years 
we had good predator control 

which also helped the wild animals 
to increase. 

The same can be said about wells 
and springs. Prior to 1937, existing 
wells were mainly hand dug surface 
water wells. Many had limited 
water and went dry in bad years. 
Then water well drilling became 
common. While the drilled well 
was mainly_ for people and 
livestock, the wild game and birds 
benefited greatly. (Yes, a bird 
would drown occasionally but 
nearly every tank had an old post or 
board floating to help them get a 
drink and get out) The person who 
never saw wild game and birds at a 
water tank hasn't been around the 
west very long. 

Up to the 1930s, vast areas of 
western range were largely 
uninhabited by man or wildlife. 
Most of the year there was no 
surface water and hand dug wells 
couldn't be had. Areas around the 
waterholes (riparian areas) that did 
exist were badly overgrazed as 
there were so few places to water. 

Lack of water was the reason 
there is so much BLM government 
land in many areas. It was never 
homesteaded as people can't 
survive without water. Without the 
ability or money to drill deep wells 
or build dams of any size, there was 
just no way to homestead and use 
it. Had the equipment and know-
how existed that we have today, 
nearly all of the land would have 
been homesteaded and privately 
owned. 

When they tell you the farmer 
and rancher has destroyed the 
habitat for wild game, that's 
poppycock and BS. They are using 
the big lie technique to steal private 
property rights. We have more 
wildlife now. Wildlife and fowl 
have a thousand times better chance 
today in the west than they had 
before man developed it. 

Other benefits for wildlife, which 
are never mentioned, are the 
irrigation and water pipe lines 

GA'RRY FETSCH 
ZONE LEI OUTSTANDING CONSERVATIONIST 
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CROP HAIL 
INSURANCE 
Protect your crops against hail 

and fire. 
Maximum protection for 
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