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A few weeks ago an Oklahoma
City paper gave columns of pub­
licity to the bumper crops raised- 
ed on bottom land that was un­
der water last Spring. The arti­
cles had a typical Chamber of 
Commerce flavor, boosting the 
resourcefulness of farmers who 
turned apparent disaster Into 
profit.

Thousands of acres of bottom 
land that had been flooded were 
left more productive by a thick 
layer of fertile silt. To the own­
ers of that land the floods might 
be regarded as a blessing in dis­
guise.

However, there Is another, less
attractive side to the story. Every 
one of those millions of tons of 
rich new deposit had to come 
from somewhere. The uplands 
were impoverished while the low 
lands were enriched.

And that’s not all. The loss to 
one was greater than the gain to 
the other. Millions of additional 
tons, instead of settling down for 
future use. drifted on to sea. Ev­
ery gallon of muddy water going 
Into the Gulf carries with it a 
small portion of this country's 
resource.

Now the flood stories are being
told again, with emphasis on the 
current damages. Homes flooded, 
crops wljied out, livestock drown­
ed. bridges wrecked and what 
not. and of course the inevitable 
story of soil depletion All that in 
spite of a system of dams once 
hailed as a means of controlling 
floods.

Comine only a few weeks after
Muenster’s soil nrogram propo­
sal*. the present flood stories are 
elcouentl.v suggestive A system 
of control mu*t be devised, a sys­
tem that controls water at its 
source rather than attempting to 
check its flow later For that 
matter, our geographical position 
at the crest of a watershed per­
mits only the one method of con­
trol.

That the water ran be control­
led at the source is obvtou* from 
conditions which any old timer 
of the community can recall. 
Farms were not cut to pieces by 
pulleys Streams did not rise as 
hjgh nor as fast after a normal 
rain, neither did thev recede as 
rapidly afterward. Even within 
the memory of this scribe there 
were many seasons during which 
the creeks did not quit running. 
For weeks after a hard rain there 
was a steady flow of clear water 
that had been held back by nat­
ure's own devices, such as grow­
ing vegetation, decaying grass 
and leaves, and esnecially the ab­
duce of down-hill furrows All 
of this, tnrtdently. held soil as 
well as water.

As a result of natural checks, 
allowing streams more time to 
carry away the surplus, the land 
Itself was permitted more time to 
absorb moisture So there was 
i-s‘- of it for the streams. Assum­
ing that annual rainfall now Is 
the same as then, we can be reas­
onably pertain that creeks today 
are transporting more water tn 
less time, and a far greater ton­
nage of dirt.

The attempt to regain some of
natures efficiency is the problem 
now challenging Muenster far­
mers To solve it will require hard 
work find ingenuitv. but the even­
tual reward will be worth every 
effort. More soil and more water 
will stay on the farm where it 
can do some good instead of 
rushing down the creek to des­
troy other people's property.

An interesting comparison re­
sults from figures released by the 
OPA and the Army Ajr Forces. 
This nation consumes 2.500.000 
gallons of black market gasoline 
daily. A thousand bombers mak 
ing the flight from England to 
Germany use 1.600.000 gallons. It 
gives an idea of what could be 
done If —

What makes our sorry record 
rven worse Is the fact that much 
of the fault lies in the OPA's own 
poor administration. The ease 
with which certain favored peo­
ple get gas for nonessential driv­
ing goads others into getting It 
through illegal channels. Refus­
als force many others to buy 
bootleg gas for essential driving. 
Arbitrary methods of determin­
ing needs encourage some people 
to drive more than they used to. 
or to give away surplus coupons 
rather than take chances of hav­
ing future allotments reduced.

Possibly as Important as any
other factor is the simple fact 
that we have regulations, which, 
like so many laws, are accepted 
with the attitude that breaking 
them is okay if a person can get 
away with It. Gas rationing to 
the vast majority of people has 
become merely an affair between 
themselves and OPA instead of a 
cooperative effort to help win 
the war.

The same applies to other 
(Continued on Page • )

CASON BROTHERS SERVE IN NAVY

OORBOVS _

WITH TH1 COLORS
Promoted To Corporal

It's Cpl. Steve Moster now. The I 
new rating was given recently in 
New Guinea where he is station­
ed with the army engineers.

At Mississippi Camp
Pvt. Ray Wilde was last week 

transferred from Camp Carson, j 
Colo., to Camp Shelby, Mjso.. 
where he serves with a medical 
unit. His new address is: Pvt
Raymond J. Wilde. 115 Evacua­
tion Hospital. S.M., Camp Shelby.' 
Miss.

At Camp Crowder, Mo.
Pvt F. A. "W impy” Kathman! 

Is receiving his basic army tra in -! 
ing at Camp Crowder. Mo., h e1 
has written his wife. Following 
six weeks of basic he will take a 
six-week course in Specialized 
Communications, according t o 
present reports, he stated.

Haa New Address
Pvt Roman Klement. son of 

Mr. and Mrs John Klement who 
has been on duty at Fort Oeorge 
O. Meade. Maryland, wrote home 
this week to advise he has a new 
address which bears an APO 
number, care of postmaster at 
New York. The parents will give 
the new address to his friend* 
wishing to write him. Another lo­
cal soldier with a siiniliar change 
of address is Sat Alois Rohmer, 
son of Mr and Mrs. Leo Rohmer 
He was formerly at Fort Benning. 
Oeorgta.

Souvenirs From Alaska
An interesting and attractive 

souvenir received by Mrs. Valen­
tine Fuhrmann this week from 
her husband, stationed in Alaska. 
Is an ash tray, fashioned from a 
■Japanese anti aircraft shell Oth­
er gifts Included tn the package 
were a linen table cloth beartng 
the map of Alaska In bright col­
ors. and a set of napkins on 
which are lmprtnted scenes of 
Alaska.

— Sidney Cason. 21, petty officer, 
third rlaaa, received the promo 
tlon to hi* present rank last week, 
lie entered the Navy on March 13. 
1943. took his boot training at 
Sun Diego. Calif., where he latev 
qual i f ied as ships rook and is
now engaged in that activity 
aboard the ship to which hr Is 
assigned. He Is at present station­
ed at San Francisco.

—Joe Cason. 18. is a seaman first 
class. Hr began his Navy career 
on January 6. this year, attending 
boot camp at San Diego, Calif., 
and last week returned to the 
States after doing a month's sea 
duty. He serves as gunner aboard 
a Merchant Marine ship. The bro 
thrrs are sons of Mr. and Mrs. 
J.B. Cason of thla city.

I Gift From Kardenla
The most recent gtft from 

Souvenir Sending Warrant Offl 
cer Oilbert Endres of Sardema ts 
a lovely Mother of Pearl rosary, 
for his mother. Mrs W H Endres 
Arriving at the same time were 
two dozen red and white carna­
tions. wired as a Easter remem­
brance. and appreciated just as 
much as though they had reach­
ed here for the day on which they 
were Intended.

Home On D are
Charles Everette AS. Is here 

this week on leave to visit his 
wife and children He has com­
pleted boot training at Farragut. 
Idaho, and expects to be trans­
ferred when he returns to his sta­
tion following the end of his vis­
it here Saturday His wife Is the 
former Miss Sylvia Walter.

Nearly All Meat 
Removed From 
Ration List

The Office of Price Adminis­
tration Wednesday made all 
meats except beef steaks and beef 
roasts ration free, effective at 
midnlgh..

The removal of ration points, 
announced by OPA Administrator 
Bowles, at a surprise press con­
ference. covers all cuts of porit. 
veal, lamb and mutton; all beef 
except the steaks and roasts; var­
iety meats, sausage, canned meats 
and canned fish.

The action was taken Bowles 
said, because (end-lease buying 
had been halted for the time be­
ing. also because of reduced army 
and navy demand, the crowding 
of storage space and the hope 
that the action will bring more 
meat to market this summer.

In the past OPA haa validated 
30 red points every two weeks 
Starting Sunday. OPA will vali­
date 30 red points every four 
weeks Red stamps R8. 88. and T8 
became valid 8unday for the pin - 
chase of butter, margarine cheese 
evaporated milk, beef steaks and 
roast — the only meat Items now 
requiring red points — but no 
more red stamps will be validated 
until June 3. four weeks hence.

OPA officials are fairly certain 
the new status will continue Tor 
at least three or four months, but 
declined to prophesy bevond that 
time Point values for beef steak 
and roast remain the same from 
7 to 13 points.

- ___

Training At Great lakes
Two Muenster boys are recelv 

ing their boot training at Oreat 
Lakes Training Center. Illinois 
They are Arthur Felderhoff, 20. 
son of Mrs. Joe Felderhoff. and 
Billy Atteberry, 18. son of Mr. 
and Mrs James Atteberry. Pre­
sent training consists of instruc­
tion In seamanship, military drill 
and general navy procedure. Dur­
ing this period a series of apti­
tude tests will be taken bv the re­
cruits to determine whether they 
will be assigned to a Naval Ser 
vice School, or to immediate act­
ive duty at sea Following com­
pletion of this period of training 
both local boys will spend a per­
iod of leave at home, according to 
a news release from the Public 
Relations office of the training 
center.

Writes From New Guinea
Pvt. Otto Walterscheid. son of 

Mrs. Molly Walterscheid writes 
that he has arrived at his over­
seas destination, somewhere in 
New Ouinea, and is about to "get 
settled” . Excerpts from his letter 
follow; " I  have already lost some 
excess weight. There is plenty of 
work here for everyone, regard­
less of rank. We don’t mind, for 
time passes much faster that way 
What a different part of the 
world this is. compared to the 
good old U.S.A. The sun doesn't 
even rise in the right direction, 
and the stars are different, or at 
least, so It seems to me. As far 
as I ’m concerned they can give 
it back to the natives. The nat­
ives don’t bother about the value 
of money, and from what few 
trinkets they have to sell a penny 
box of matches will buy more 
than a pound, which is $3.20 in 
Australian currency. We are be­
ing fed well and the army gives 
us cigarettes. In general things 
aren’t so bad. Tell everybody hel­
lo for me.”

MAY FESTIVAL AND  
DANCE TO BE HELD 
HERE ON MAY 29TH

Final plans were made Thurs­
day for a community May Festi­
val to be held In the Muenster 
parish hall on May 29. when 
members of the local St. Anne's 
8ociety. the sponsor group, gath­
ered for a business meeting and 
social.

According tq plans the May 
festival will begin at 3 oclock in 
the afternoon, and continue on 
during the evening hours, sup­
plemented by a dance. Commit 
tees were appointed to take char­
ge of the various entertainment 
features and refreshments.

It was announced that the soc 
iety will have a reception next 

I Sunday. May 7. for all those des- 
| iring to join the organization

During the social hour games 
| of 42 were enjoyed and refresh- 
! ments were served to a large as- 
j semblage.

Ed Gossett To Give 
Rad io Address Tonight

By invitation. Congressman Ed 
Gossett will speak on a nation 
wide hook up. NBC facilities, 
from Washington. DC., this Fri­
day evening. May 5. at 9 45 Tex­
as time, on the subject of "Treatv 
Making and Winning the Peace.”

The congressman is an elo­
quent and forceful speaker and 
this address promises to be one 
of outstanding interest.

----------- v-----------

At Victoria Field
Aviation Cadet Ray Berend. of 

Gainesville, formerly of this city, 
was last week transferred from 
Majors Field. Oreenville, to Aloe 
Field, Virtoria. Texas, for advan­
ced pilot’s training. 'H e is to be 
commissioned and receive his 
wings the middle of June.

New Aldermen Take 
Office In Monday 
City Council Meet

Principal procedure of the city 
council at its regular meeting 
Monday evening was the install 
anon of its two alderman, elected 
last month. They are R L. McNel- 
ley and LA. Schoech Also sworn 
into office was Rosa Driever as 
city secretary replacing F A 
Kathman. Jr., member of thr 
armed forces.

There are little changes In the 
appointments for the coming 
year Announced by Mayor J M 
Wetnzapfel they are as follows; 
Mayor pro tern. J A  Fisher: 
street commissioner. J A  : Fisher 
u 11111 le * commissioner. I A 
Schoech: fire commlsfloner. R I, 
McNelley. p a r k  commissioner. 
Andy Hofbauer; sanitary com­
missioner. Henry Stelzer; secre­
tary. Rosa Driever; treasurer Su­
sie Bernauer; marshal J P Flus- 
che; tax assessor collector A te­
ll na Miller, and corporate )udge.
R L McNelley McNelley replaces 
Nick Miller, resigned

Other business during the ses­
sion consisted of a decision to call 
In another $3,000 worth of sewer 
bonds on August 1 setting of the 
tax rate at $1 50 for the current 
year; appointment of PJ. Hess.
R L. McNelley and I A. Schoech 
to serve on the equalization board 
and plana for the annual city 
wide cleanup to be held soon.

Also diseased was the prevail 
ing dog nuisance and plans are 
in the making to tax all dogs 
within the city and have them 
licensed and wear collars

--------------V-------------- .

SGT. JACK NEEDHAM
WRITES FROM P O W
CAMP IN GERMANY

Mrs. Ruth Needham of Mvra 
Is in receipt of a card from herj 
son. 8. Sgt. Jack Needham, a 
German prisoner of war. which1 
reads as follows:

"Oot shot down over Oermany. I 
Am OK A bullet bounced off my ! 
head, no scar or handicap will re- j  
suit The Oermari Government 
respects Geneva Conference re­
lative to -prisoners of war. Morale 
is high, life pleasant. Oive $50 00 
to Rett Cross for me. That is the 
best friend we have here. Write 
ail my friends. Not assigned an 
address yet. Don t write Will let 
you know immediately. Confiden­
tially. parachutes are wonderful.'.’

The r.ard was dated February 
24, and sent through the War 
Department, reached Mrs. Need­
ham on April 29. This is the first 
message from her son since he 
was taken prisoner on February 
23, this year.

----------- v-----------

TWO INCH RAIN IS 
WELCOMED BY LOCAL j 
FARMERS, GARDENERS

Approximately two inches of 
rain fell here Saturday and Mon­
day. The precipitation on Satur­
day began at about 10 am. after 
the sky had darkened heavily, 
and a mild electrical storm ac 
companied the down-pour. On 
Sunday the sky was still over 
cast but only a few sprinkles fell. 
Late Monday afternoon another 
hard shower pelted this section.

The rain was the first of any 
consequence in several weeks and 
was welcomed by farmers for 
spring oats, pasture grass, and 
crops In general, and was a boon 
to thirsty victory gardens.

Seven Muenster 
Ladies Graduate 
As Nurse’s Aides

Class of 45 From County
Capped In Ceremony At 
Howze Station Hospital
Forty-five Cooke County wo­

men, Including seven from this 
city, were capped at formal exer­
cises held in the auditorium of 
the Red Cross building at Camp 
Howze station hospital Wednes­
day evening of last week, mark­
ing the completion of their Nur 
se's Aide training course. Muen 
ster ladies rapped at the ceremo­
nies were Mesdames O.H. Hell- 
man. Henry Fette. John Flsch, 
Jim Cook. Nellie Johns and Miss­
es Florene Endres and Dorothy 
Winstead

Mrs. Walter Lippmann. nation­
al director of volunteer Nurse's 
Aides corps of the Red Cross and 
wife of the Internationally fa­
mous editor and columnist, was 
principal speaker at the rites 
She complimented the class on 
being the first army trained Nur­
se's Aides in the state of Texas, 
and stressed the importance of 
this training to the community 
and rountv not only during war 
time, but also In peace time when 
emergencies arise and disaster 
strikes.

At the outbreak of the war. Mrs 
Lippmann said there were 300 j 
Nurse's Aides in 13 chapters: to­
day there 167.000 aides in 1225 
chapters throughout the United 
States. In Alaska. In Puerto Rico , 
and Hawaii. Uniformity of train 
ing. identical rules and basic pro-i 
redure make the Aides interchan­
geable among the various chap 
lers.

Mrs Lippmann was introduced 
by Mrs Beatrice Siebel. chairman 
of volunteer services. Cooke coun 
tv chapter. American Red Cross, 
who officiated at the program, 
introducing the guests of honor 
from the Eighth Service Com­
mand and from the local Red 
Cron chapter.

Col John P  Wheeler, comman­
ding officer. Camp Howze. was 
Introduced followed by Col W il­
liam M Caffee. Camp surgeon, 
station hospital; Lt Col. Frank­
lin K Domak. chief of surgical 
staff: Lt Col Utle I Klelbached- 
idel. chief of the army nurse 
corps. Eighth Service Command 
Major Robert W Johnson, exec­
utive officer, station hospital: 
Mat Charles A Ault, chief of 
medical service Capt Lillian E 
Ehlert, chief nurse station hos­
pital and Cant Ada Jewell of 
the Eighlh 8ervice Command 
staff.

Also present were J L. Leazer. 
chairman of the county chapter 
of the Red Cross: Mrs Alma Joh­
ansen executive secretary of the 
Red Cross; Mrs Irene Oosltn. 
chairman o f the Nurses Aide 
committee: Joe Donahoe, field
director. Red Cross: Mrs. C.L.
Jackson, class instructor and Lt. 
Marcella Ducrest. Instructor from 
the station hospital, and Judge 
Carroll Sullivant, OCD coordin­
ator.

Chaplain R A. Taylor, camp 
chaplain, gave the Invocation as 
the audience stood following the 
entrance of the class of Nurse's 
Aides, who marched to the front 
of the room and took their plac­
es The audience then sang ‘ ‘Ood 
Bless America.”  after which Mrs 
Lippmann gave her address.

Mrs. Helen Tyler, Nurse's Aide 
corps captain, and Mrs. Marcia 
McAfee from the first Nurse's 
Aide class, stood before the group 
and as each new member to be 
capped came forward she lighted 
a candle from those held by the 
two charter members as the cap 
was placed on her head.

Oath Administered
As soon as each member was 

canned unison repetition of the 
civilian defense oath took place 
It. was administered bv Judae 
Sullivant and the Nurse’s Aide 
pledge was read bv Mrs Jackson 
A vocal solo. "Angels of Mercy" 
was rendered by Mrs. McArdle 
accompanied on the piano by 
Miss Virginia Kimbriel followed 
by benediction bv Chaplain Hugh 
L. Rauwolf. "The Star Spangled 
Bonner" by the entire group con 
eluded the ceremonies.

Following the capping. Col. 
Caffee was host to approximately 
400 special guests at a buffet sup­
per In the officers’ club at the 
station hospital, honoring the 
graduates .

Attending the program. In ad­
dition to the Muenster women 
were their guests, as follows: G. 
H. Heilman. Mrs. Richard Fette. 
Henry Fette, Jerry Fette. Mr. and 
Mrs. W.H. Endres, Urban and 
Miss Dolly Endres. Mrs. Valentine 
Fuhrmann. John Flsch, Jtm Cook 
Mr. and Mrs. J.R. Winstead, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Rudy Heilman.

Program Planned 
For May 21st By 
4th Degree K-C's

Pontifical Mass Will
Headline Events Which
Also Include Banquet

Meeting in regular monthly 
session Sunday afternoon mem­
bers of the Bishop Danglmayr 
General Assembly Fourth Degree 
Knights of Columbus planned a 
program for May 21 when the 
certificate of organization will be 
presented to the new assembly In 
connection with a religious and 
social observance of the event.

Presiding at the meeting was 
J.M. Weinzapfel, faithful navigp 
tor, and a committee to take 
charge of plans for the celebra­
tion was named. Rev. Thomas 
Buergler, J P. Flusche. Ben 8ey- 
ler, J.W. Fisher and Adolph Herr 
were appointed.

Highlighting the day's ceremo­
nies will be a pontifical high 
mass, the Churcns most sacred 
and colorful religious service. O f­
ficiating will be The Most Rev 
Augustine Dnnglmayr Auxiliary' 
Bishop of Dallas, a native of this 
community, tn whose honor the 
local assembly was named. The 
sermon for the occasion will be 
delivered by a guest speaker.

Following the religious obser­
vance. the parish hall will be the 
scene of a banquet for which 
Fourth Degree Knights and their 
ladies from the North Texas Dis­
trict will be guests. Hundreds of 
Invitations are being sent out. 
During the banquet hour Dr. E. 
W. Laake of Dallas. Master of the 
Fourth Degree. North Texas Dis 
trlct. will present the certificate 
of organization, and a series of 
talks will be given, including one 
by His Excellency Bishop Dangl­
mayr.

Sunday's meeting was attend 
ed by the following out of town 
members Chaplain Joseph O. 
Ouillet and Chaplain Albert A. 
Bergeron, both of Camp Howze: 
H A . Umpman Denison: F E. 
Schmitz. Oainesvllle: Rev Ed­
ward Devers and L W  Flusche. 
Decatur.

----------- v-----------

PVT. JAMES WILDE, 
RELATIVE OF LOCAL 
COUPLE, IS WOUNDED

Pvt James Wilde, son of Mr. 
and Mrs Frank Wilde of Here 
ford, former Muenstcrites was 
seriously wounded recently during 
battle action on an island In the 
8outh Pacific. The Information 
came from Pvt Wilde tn a letter 
to his parents. He In now recover­
ing from his wounds In an army 
hospital.

**I ran Into more than I could 
handle. I guess.” Wilde wrote He 
had taken part In three previous 
battle actions before he was 
wounded In the letter he stated 
that despite hls Injuries, he was 
able to complete the Job he was 
doing and that he hopes to be 
back In fighting shape as soon as 
possible He is 21 and has been In 
the service less than a year.

Perhaps one reason for hls rag 
rrness to get back Into action is 
the fact that he has a chance to 
make $50 for every Jap ear he 
brings bark to the states. Hls 
uncle. John Wilde of LaSara. 
Texas, offered the bounty when 
the Private was on duty In the 
Admiralty Islands A letter to ibe 
parents some time ago was writ­
ten on stationery taken from the 
Japs.

Friends wishing to write to 
James may get hls address from 
hls uncle and aunt. Mr. and Mrs. 
J.B. Wilde of this city.

----------- v-----------

TIRE INSPECTION HAS 
BEEN DISCONTINUED

Periodic inspections of tires has 
been discontinued for the time 
being by the OPA, hut ration 
book holders are warned not to 
throw away their tire inspection 
sheets, since these are still nec­
essary to obtain gasoline and for 
registering a vehicle.

This warning was Issued thro­
ugh Cooke county war price and 
rationing board last Wednesday. 
The tire Inspection chords must, 
be presented before the next ra­
tion series can be obtained the 
board emphasized.

Garden Club Changes 
Regular Meeting Date

The Civic League and Garden 
Club meeting has been changed 
from May 12 to the following 
Friday, May 19. it was announ­
ced this week and members arr 
urged to remember the change of 
schedule.

Mrs. Julia Kelly. Cooke county 
home demonstration agent, will 
be guest speaker at the session. 
She will tell about landscaping.

B '
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NEWS BRIEFS
Short Items of Interest About Folks You Know
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J.C. Trachta and Miss Isabel 
Walterscheid visited In Wichita 
Falls Friday.

Miss Eugenia Walter* of Fort 
Worth spent the weekend here
with relatives.

Little Linda Ann Yosten spent 
last week in Era with her uncle 
and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. Carl Ber- 
end.

A.R. Hoehn returned to Bir- 
minham, Ala., during the week­
end after being here for the fun­
eral of his nephew, Lt. C. M.
Hoehn. --.

Edward Sicking, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ben Sicking, is recovering 
normally from an operation per­
formed at Gainesville sanitarium 
last Saturday morning.

O
Kyle Waggoner of Hays com 

munity is confined to a Gaines­
ville hospital suffering f r o m  
pneumonia. He was unimproved
early this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Wilson 
and little daughter. Samantha. 
Mu nt Tuesday at Fort Worth vi- 
sitln1 Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hunt. 
Mrs. Hunt is the former Miss 
Charlene Wilson.

Sunday dinner guests at the 
Joe Swirczyriski home were Miss­
es Rita and Catherine Rwirczy- 
rski of Gainesville. Set Joe Bcz- 
ner and Eugene Schmitz of Lind 
say.

_ • __
Ben Heilman is reported mak­

ing a normal recovery from an 
operation for the removal of his 
appendix at Gainesville sanitar­
ium Saturday morning. His wife 
is staying with him.

. - » i -
little  Albert and Gilbert Knabe 

twin sons of Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
K n a b e .  observed their ninth 
birthday Sundav with a party for 
a group of little friends at the fa­
mily home Games, refreshments 
and gift* made it a gay affair.

August Lutkenhaus who served

in the army with a military police 
company for two years arrived 
home last week following receipt 
of a medical discharge. He is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. George Lut­
kenhaus.

Since the beginning of the 
week Miss Imelda Felderhoff is 
employed at the Muenster State 
Bank after school hours. Fillow- 
ing the close of the term, when 
she graduates from high school, 
she will be on duty full time.

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. J. B 
Cason are their son-in-law and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Parkinson and two children of 
Houston He leaves for the Navy 
on the 11th of this month and 
Mrs. Parkinson and children will 
make their home here with her 
parents for the duration.

w o rn  i y i s t r  %in  

DR. H. O. K IN N E  
OPTOMETRIST

O.iln> \ ill«» — :— Tm u

D R .  R .  O . B L A G G
Chiropractor Radionics 

Colonthcrapv 
X-Rny

Calls Made Day or Night 
sit N\ llixon Phone 544

Excellent Food 

Properly Served

C u r t i s
Sandwich Shop

Koxi t aliform* (i.'ilni'SYllle

Misses Marie and Evelyn Swin- 
glrr lett last Thursday to Join 
their mother. Mrs. Joe Swingler. 
i' Livermore Calif. where she is 
staying since her son. Earl Swln 
gler. CM3C, member of the Sea- 
bees. underwent a major opera­
tion a few weeks ago. They plan 
to stay there about six weeks.

Neighbors and friends gave a 
charivari honoring Mr and Mrs. 
Martin Hacker, recently married 
couple, at their home last Wed­
nesday evening Informal diver­
sion. music and refreshments, 
brought by the guests, were en­
joyed by a large group.

--.
Mr and Mrs. Paul Endres are 

Uie parents of a daughter. Patsy, 
bom at the local clinic Tuesday. 
The baby was baptised by Father 
Thomas Wednesday afternoon 
assisted by Seaman and Mrs 
Charles Everette. uncle and aunt 
as sponsors Everette stood as 
proxy for Warrant Officer Qtlbert 
Endres. stationed In Sardenta.

Good Conduct Medal
Cpl, Louise Schmitz, daughter 

of Mr. and Mrs. I IM  Schmitz 
was recently awarded the good 
conduct medal at Pueblo Arm* 
Air Base She Is a file clerk with 
the WAC detachment at base 
headquarters and has been In the 
service since March 11. 1943.

I
| Receives Promotion

Sidney Cason was last week 
nremoted to the rank of Petty 
O ff leer third class. He is a mem­
ber of the Naw, stationed at San 
Francisco. Calif His parents are 
Mr and Mr J B Cason of this 
rity.

t \K»> O F  T i l  I N K S

We gratefully acknowledge ev­
ery kindness and all expressions 
>f sympathy during our recent 
sorrow We appreciate every con­
sideration. all the thoughtful 
deeds, the flowers and spiritual 
bouquets.

A T  Hoehn and Family

O u r y p f e r e h a r i  t ^ M a r in e

T a n k e r s
Th is is  a war of petroleum,
Not a tank could roll, n  ̂
a plane could fly and 
a gun could fire 
without it.

The first petroleum was __ 
in barrels aboard ships. In 1886 
the English developed a bulk 
tanker which could unload in 
three days instead of a month.

________ longshoremen
protested and petitioned 
Congress to halt the build 
ing of tankers.

3S*Q X  
NOEwav

•7.03%

type continued to increase, 
however, so that at the begin­
ning of this war we had one- 
fourth of the world's tankers.

Our tanker* now supply all our 
allied armies.it takes four tank­
ers per fighting day to keep our 
at mies in action in Europe alone.

npt/on courtesy o f
■Xr'Merr*a»tMon*elHit,tuU Mr it Cetyrqht jv e to rt*

of this city and attended Facred 
Heart .school. He also attended 
Sublaco, Ark., Academy, graduat 
ing in 1939. For the past year ne 
has been employed with a whole­
sale grocery company in Gaines­
ville. Both have been active in the 
local Catholic youth societies and 
both are members of the Muen 
ster Youth Band.

----------- v-----------
— Bomb the Japs With Junk!—

Please Patronize Our Advertiser*

WAR BONDS
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Front Wheel Alignment 
Checked FREE!

Don’t worry about out-of-line front wheels wearing out 
precious tires. Be positive. You can see the machine reading 
yourself on our Bean Alignment Machine.

Motors tuned, using Motor Analyzer. Brake Service. Com­
plete mechanical service by expert mechanics.

* >
Radiators cleaned and repaired in our own shop.

HILBURN MOTOR CO.
AUTHORIZED FORD DEALER 

Dixon at Broadway Phone 966
'7/7777>777777777/7/777777777/7J7777777/7777?WMW77777777V.Vm/.77AV7.?Z?77777J,’,V7/??7/:'777Z77777? #

New

CLARA HENSCHEID 
AN !) EDWARD ENDRES 
MARRIED TUESDAY

Marriage rites performed here 
at Sacred Heart Church Tuesday 
morning at 9 o'clock united Mis.- 
Clara Henscheid. daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert Henscheid. and 
Edward Endres. son of Mr. and 
Mrs. R R, Endres Rev. Thomas 
Buercler, pastor, officiated at the

3 W I C K  B O Y
P U R E  W H IT E  L E A D

P A I N T

And

PURE LINSEED OIL

Will make the best job 
you can get for protec­

tion of your buildings.

SEE THE OLD RELIABLE

W aples Painter Co.
Leo N. Henscheid, Mgr. Muenster

ceremony and was celebrant of 
the nuptial high mass.

Music for the mass was render­
ed by the church choir, undt r 
direction of Leo N Henscheid. 
uncle of the bride, and u’so tak­
ing part in the singing were the 
bride s father, another uncle Wm 
Henscheid. aud the grooms un 
tie. Ben Luke, all choir member* 
Serving as acolytes were Hugh 
Endres. brother of the groom Leo 
Felderhoff. cousin of the bride 
and Melvin Herr, cousin or ih* < 
groom.

For her wedding the bride wore 
a lovely floor length gown of 
white marquisette, fashioned with 
lace yoke, fitted basque bodice, 
long sleeves pointed at the wrLst 
and full, gathered skirt The lace 
of the gown was repeated in the 
full length veil of Illusion which 
it edged, and was held In place 
with a ruffle of lace Easter lilies 
in colonial arrangement formed 
the brjdal bouquet. For "some­
thing old” the bride wore an heir 
loom gold cross and chain, for 
merly belonging to her maternal 
grandmother, the late Mrs. Eliz­
abeth Hesse, and for "something 
borrowed" she carried a white 
linen and lace handkerchief be 
longing to the groom a mother.

Attending as bridesmaid was the 
brides sister. Miss Rosalie Hrn- 
scheid. while another sister. Lit 
tie Mis* Dolores Henscheid. was 
Junior bridesmaid The latter car­
ried a pearl and silver rosary 
which was blessed preceding the 
ceremony and presented to the 
bride as a gift from the bride­
groom.

Miss Rosalie wore a taffeta 
frock of yellow, made with fitted 
bodlce^hort sleeves and full 
floor length flounced skirt. A 
headdress of pink carnations 
and a pink carnation corsage 
completed her costume. Little 
Miss Dolores was attired in a 
frock of orchid taffeta, made 
identical to that worn by the 
bridesmaid with a head dress and 
a shoulder corsage of white car­
nations.

Jimmy Endres was best mai 
for his brother, and another 
brother. Master Donald Endres 
served as the Junior attendant 
and carried the wedding ring.

The bride's mother wore a gold 
and black ensemble with a white 
c a r n a t i o n  corsage and the 
groom s mother wore navy blue 
with a white carnation corsage.

Following the service, the bri 
dal party were guests at break­
fast in the home of the bride’s 
uncle and aunt Mr. and Mrs. 
Nick Yosten and at noon, the 
immediate families of the couple 
were present, at the bride's home 
for dinner. The center of inter­
est at the Henscheid home was 
the bride’s table It was centered 
with a large decorated cake, flan 
ked with arrangements of orchid 
and yellow sweet peas. The meal 
was served by candle light, six 
large white tapers furnishing the 
illumination. Above the table, 
hanging from the ceiling, were a 
group of silver wedding bells, 
showered with sprays of orchid 
and yellow sweet peas.

At three o'clock an Informal re­
ception was held for some 200 re­
latives and friends o f  the couple, 
after which a buffet supper wras 
served, followed by a dance on a 
specially erected platform.

It was during the latter event 
that Mr. and Mrs. Endres left 
on a wedding trip, the destination 
of which was not revealed. For 
traveling Mrs. Endres wore a 
beige two-piece frock with white 
accessories and a corsage of whit* 
roses. When they return they will 
make their home on north Main 
street in the Zipper bungalow.

Both young people are natives

Con Grandmothers join 
the Elves, Leprechauns, I 
Gnomes,and Little Men's j 
Chowder and Marching 
Society, Mr. O 'M a lley? '

No,Barnaby. ..But 
they're enlisting in 
the Grandmothers 
W or Bond League.

ReadyNow
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$2.98 $1.25 to $2.50

$1.00 Plus Tax

29c to 59c $1.25 to $2.98

$2.98 to $5.00 
Plus Tax

Tho Ladies Shop
MRS. J. P. GO8LIN 

i 1 Gainesville



PLANE
TALK

®Y

Rowland Bnnutan

Many of the controls and indi­
cating instruments on an airplane 
require some form of electrical 
energy in order to do their work. 
Tliis electrical power is supplied 
from a storage battery or an elec- 
ti ic generator, but the usual prac­
tice is a combination of the two.

In the earlier stages of aircraft, 
move reliance was placed on a stor­
age battery because of its simpli­
city of construction and mainten­
ance as compared to the electric 
generator. In the advancement of 
aviation the generator has taken 
over an increasing portion of the 
work. Rapid improvement in gen­
erator design and simplicity in re­
pair and maintenance are the pri­
mary reasons.

sjH

Thin Aviulrctrie weighing
onlv 110 lb#, deliver* 7Vfc kw  
* •' h l* equal to the normal re* 
quin menu r f  ten ordinary homo*.

A second advantage for the use 
of more generators and fewer bat­
teries is the saving in weight.

There art- two general classifies- 
ti"n« into which aircraft electric 
generators fall, the engine driven 
and wind driven. In most larger 
planes electric power is supplied 
by an auxiliary. The Avialectric 
P w t  plant is in itself a complete 
u; it composed of a generator and 
a lightweight engine of aircraft 
d ign that actuates the generator.

On the struts or guide wires of 
smaller airplanes there is some- 
tin; seen a generator and small 
propeller. The purpose of this pro­
peller is just the opposite of the 
m ain propeller or air screw. The 
main air screw nulls the plane 
through the air whereas the small 
propeller is driven by the slip 
Cream of the airplane. This func- 

tmns like an old-fashioned wind- 
null, the propeller turning the 
generator.

THE POCKETBOOK 
or KNOWLEDGE Mr

torn

BtfwmtootYRo oee 
seem alaiwv.froa 
Blood plasma, which 
so ts  6  T IM HM  MR 

AS PLASMA Otm *t**r AMt/umaunsi M e t  a  amp mere m  
-rue umot mrnt-saaaus mu not tmwat

M O S A I C S
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Honor Roll
ot i i n' s who made the honor

la ;r six w eeks are Imelda 
i'T Th< resa Mae Pels,

’ rot Zipper, La Rue Felder 
\tax Grace Wtmmcr. Joe 

' V- o i pt e l .  Rosalce Muller. Cor­
nier Puhrmann, and Philomena 
Felderhoff.

fv o  students, both sophomores 
iin 1 special distinction during , 

the Inst six weeks with an ail A 
report card They are Theresa ! 
Mac Pels and Margaret Zipper.

t'tnle Tests
• '••• wearing a more' 

inner tilts week for 
it the fatal week of the State 
Te ts. The Tests are being given
on Wednesday. Thursday and 
Friday of this week.

•‘Don't Take My Penny!**
Is A Big Success

Congratulations! Members of 
the cast of the three act comedy! 
According to various reporta ev­
eryone enjoyed the comedy which 
the Dramatics Club staged. And 
if the income means anything, 
then the comedy was a real suc­
cess. We realized more than ever 
before.

We wish to thank everyone wno 
attended the play and gave en­
couragement to those who took 
part in It.

G ift To Library
"The Sun Comes U p ’ by Dr. 

Clarence LaFayette 8tocks. a col­
lection of poems by the author 
was added to the library last 
week. The book Is a personal gift 
of the author, a well known den­
tist In QatnesvtUe.

During the past few weeks a 
number of new books have also 
been added to the library shelves. 
Among the new titles are ’The 
Family That Overtook Christ". 
"The Dove Files South". "The 
Robe", and "Thunderhead'.

Alumni in Service Visit School
Two of our alumni In service 

Chief Petty Officer 3rd Class Har 
old Luke, of the Navy and Sea 
man 1st class Vincent Becker of 
the Coast Ouard. visited at 8 H 
H.S. We enjoyed your visits very 
much boys and hope that you will 
visit us again In the near future. 
Harold, who graduated In 1943. 
has Just completed hla training 
and ts now ready for active ser­
vice.

Red Cross Shows Film
Last week the students enjoyed 

not only an interesting but also 
an instructive picture on First 
Aid. The picture showed the First 
Aid Treatment to be given In ca­
se of injury before a doctor ar­
rives. We enjoyed the picture and

STATEMENT OF THE CONDITION OF

The Gainesville National Bank
GAINESVILLE. TEXAS 

Close of Business April 13, 1944 

RESOURCES
loans nnd Discounts ............      826.578.81
OvfrJraft" .........................— ..............- ....................  12.878.87
Furniture & Fixtures .............. ...........................  12,000 00
Real Estate ....................................................................  1 00

’ •v k in Federal Reserve Bank 6,400.00
t m. n nris   1.103.800.60
Othr; Bonds Warrants 179,457.48
Pi!! of Exchange 18,833.23
r  s! ,,nd Right Exrh..........................  1,890.732.69
Total Available Cash .............................................  3,198.823.40

TO TAL ...............................  3,856,679.94

LIABILITIES
Capital Stock. Common ..................... 100.000.00

Preferred ....    55,000.00
Total Capital Stock ..................................................  155,000.00
SurnUi ............................................ -...................  57.000.00
Undivided Prefits .......................................................  36.721.03
R ev ives  ......................................................*.............  15,000.00
DEPOSITS:
p t,• ,    21,610.54
Individual .......................  3,571.348.37
Total Deposits ..........................................................  3,582,958.91

TO TAL ...............................  3,856,679.9*

DIRECTORS

B.A. Dillard 
J.A. Smoot 

T,cRov Robinson 
R.S. Rose 

G.W. Brown 
O.T. Carr 

W.T. Bonner 
J.W. Schad 

R.P. Wilson

OFFICERS

B.A. DILLARD, Pres.

J.A. SMOOT, Vice Pies. 

LeROY ROBINSON, Cash. 

AJ. FIPP, Ass’t. Cash. 

J.L. BURCH, Ass t. Ca.

we wish to thank Mr. Kiel who 
brought the picture to us.

4-H Club M e r ts "~
The regular meeting of the 4-H j 

club for both boys and girls was 
held last Monday afternoon.

The girls had as their topic of 
discussion the remodeling of old j 
garments. Mrs. Kelly also dem­
onstrated the best method of put­
ting a hem in a garment Mrs. 
Wetnzapfel and Miss Olivia Stock 
sponsors, were present at the 
meeting.

The boy a worked out balanced 
rations In the feeding of livestock 
County Agent Albert Brient was 
present.

-----------v-----------

HIGH SCHOOL PLAY 
SHOWS TO CAPACITY 
AUDIENCE SUNDAY

Sacred Heart High School's 
three act comedy. Don t Take 
My Penny", showed to a rapacity 
audience In the parish hall Sun­
day night. The witty dialogue 
continued without Interruption on 
the part of the actors for more 
than two hours and showed the 
capable direction of Sister M 
Oeraldlne. and the efforts of the 
cast.

All character Impersonations 
were ably enacted by the seven 
teen participating students. Out 
standing was Oeorge Swlrcsynskl 
for his excellent portrayal of a 
feminine role

Composing the cast were Miss 
Juanita Weinzapfel. as Penny, 
and Misses Geneva Oremmtnger. 
Gladys Wilde. Johnann Seyler, 
Alma Marie Luke. Marian Starke. 
Imelda Felderhoff. Dolly Endres. 
and Msrv Ann Reiter, and A l­
phonse Koesler. Robert Bayer. 
Alvin Fuhrmann. Henry Yosten. 
Oeorge Swlrcsynskl. Leo Felder­
hoff. Harry Sicking and Billy Joe 
MUler.

-------------- v--------------

BAPTIST CHURCH HAS 
OFFICERS ELECTION

Members of the local Bible 
Baptist church held a business 
meeting on the evening of Wed­
nesday. April 26. for the purpose 
o f electing new officers, the re­
sults of which are:

Mrs. Cecil Ice. Sunday school 
superintendent: Primary teacher. 
Mrs. Sanner; Intermediate tea­
cher. Mrs. Herman Pierce: Adult 
teacher. J B. Cason with Herman 
Pierce assistant: Sunday school 
s e c r e t a r y ,  Mrs. John Beard: 
Church clerk, Mrs. EO. Teague: 
Church treasurer. JR . Cason: 
Song leader. Mrs. Joe Parker, and 
pianist, Mrs. DC Kline.

Rev. Larkin Howard from Bible 
Baptist Institute. Fort Worth. Is 
to fill the pulpit Sunday morning 
and evening. He comes highly re­
commended.

Schedule of services is 8unday 
School at 10 o’clock: preaching at 
11 o’clock: evening services at 8 
p.m. Prayer meeting is held every 
Wednesday evening with J.B. Ca­
son as leader.

RATION VALUE OF 
BUTTER, MARGARINE 
HAS BEEN REDUCED

The ration point value of 
creamery butter has been reduced 
from 16 to 12 red points per 
pound, effective since Sunday 
through June 3, OPA has an­
nounced.

The same order cut the ration 
price of margarine from 6 to 2 
red points, also effective since 
Sunday and through June 3.

Point value for farm or country 
butter is reduced to 8 points per 
pound, and processed butter frqm 
6 to 4 points.

Shortening, lard, salad oil and 
cooking oil continue point free in 
May.
SOME VEGETABLES ARE 
NOW POINT-FREE

Tomatoes, corn, asparagus beets 
leafy greens, spinach, blackeye 
peas and garbanzo beans have 
been added to the point free list 
of processed foods through June 
30. Point values have been re­
duced on spaghetti sauce, soups 
and a variety o f jellies, while 
some processed foods, including 
'tomato catsup and chili sauce 
and tomato juice in large con­
tainers. have been increased in 
point value.

--------------V--------------

CAMP HOWZE IS WAC  
ENLISTMENT STATION

Camp Howze at Gainesville has 
been designated as the WAC en­
listment station for North Texas, 
it was announced Tuesday.

Heretofore WAC recruits have 
been sent to Dallas for qualifying, 
examinations.

F R A N K  S C H I L L I N G
# Agent for

State Reserve l i f e  Insurance Co.

Muenstcr. Texas

■■ -■ - ■ ■

When In 
Gainesville Cat 

at the 
Coffee Pot

Gene and Milton Tutt 
Props.

1 Block North of State
■

Back From Sea Duty
Mr. and Mrs. J.B. Cason had 

a letter from their son, Joe Cason 
SIC, Tuesday advising that he is 
back in the states after doing a

month's sea duty. Simultaneous­
ly a package of souvenirs and 
gifts from Hawaii arrived for the 
parents from their son.

BINDER TWINE
Get your season’s supply now and put an end 

to your twine worries.

This is high quality twine and is our only ship­

ment for this year.

FMA STORE
MUENSTER

Used Cais
IN A-l SHAPE

’41 Ford 2-door Deluxe 
’39 Pontiac 2-door 
’■10 Chevrolet Coupe 
'40 Plymouth 2-door, Radio & Heater 
’38 Ford “ 60”  coupe 
'41 Plymouth Special Deluxe 2-door 
’39 Chevrolet 4-door 
2 ’38 Chevrolet 2-door 
’38 Terrapjane 4-door

North Texas Motors
E. S. McGehee, Owner Gainesville

While son Jim helped capture Hill 205

T iere was a war crisis this Spring 
on thousands of dairy farms. 

Months of dry weather killed the fall- 
planted small grain crops. Re-plant­
ing, new planting had to be done.

It meant far more than feed for 
cows.Itmeant milk and theproductsof 
milk to meet the nation’s vital need.

Of cheese the U. S. Government’s 
requirement alone this year is esti­
mated at nearly 450 million pounds. 
(Cheese can carry valuable nutrients 
of milk to ernr fighting men overseas

and to our fighting allies.) And, for 
you and other civilians, 500 million 
more pounds of cheese are needed.

You hear about the brilliant 
actions of our boys on the battle 
fronts, including the sons of our 
dairymen. None of us at home can 
match what they do for victory. But 
none of us here works more days, 
more hours, more valiantly than the 
people left on America’s dairy farms. 
They’re in the front line of the 
battle for food. . .  and they know it.

Because of the tremendous demand, 
both military and civilian, you may 
not be able to get as much Kraft 
Cheese as you would like, or get your 
favorite varieties— Kraft American. 
" Old English’* “ Philadelphia * 
Brand Cream Cheese, Velveeta, and 
so on. But you may be sure, as always, 
that any cheese or cheese food which 
bears the Kraft name represents the 
very highest standard of quality.

K R A F T  C H E E S E  C O M P A N T



There will be a Sing-Song and 
Pie Supper at Hays school aud- 
itoruim this Friday evening, May 
5, at 8 p.m., and the public is in­
vited to attend.

PRESSURE COOKERS 
TESTED EVERY SATURDAY

Cooke county pressure cooker 
owners may get a free test any 
Saturday afternoon by taking 
their cooker to Gainesville where 
Mrs. Pittman is on duty at the 
ladies lounge in the court house 
to render this service. There is 
no charge and the cooker is test­
ed while the owner waits.

Muenster Hospitality 
Gets Boost From Fort 
Worth C of C Official

The following letter was writ­
ten by Mrs. Edwin T. Phillips, 
manager of the Civic Affairs 
Department, Fort Worth Cham­
ber of Commerce, to Mayor J.M. 
Weinzapfel, following her recent 
visit in this city during the post­
war planning program;

‘ For a long time Fort Worth 
people will hear me tell them 
about the interesting and happy 
visit I had with the people of 
Oainesville, Muenster and Valley 
View. Although you folks have a 
reputation for good food, you 
really outdid yourselves on the 
luncheon. However, much as I 
enjoyed the good food, my prin­
cipal interest, of course was in 
talking to you, Father Thomas, 
Mrs. Myrick, the president of the 
Civic League and Garden Club, 
and other leaders. In my conver­
sation with them, my visit to the 
Cooperative and in the emphasis 
of spiritual values which any vis­
itor to your community must feel, 
I sensed the philosophy of group 
action about which you talked.

•'When any of your people 
come to Fort Worth, I hope they 
will sense the kind of hospitality 
which we enjoyed in being with 
you. Come by the Chamber of 
Commerce, and although I can’t 
guarantee to produce a lemon pie 
as good as the one I sampled at 
Muenster. I promise you a warm 
welcome.”

paid by the plaintiff W.E. Mea­
dor, and the unknown heirs of 
the said Wm. E. Meador, deceas­
ed, own an undivided 528-720 in­
terest in said property, subject to 
such part of the taxes paid by 
the plaintiff W.E. Meador, as is 
more fully shown by plaintiffs’ 
Petition on file in this suit.

The officer executing this pro­
cess shall promptly execute the 
same according to law, and make 
due return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my 
hand and seal of said Court at 
office in Gainesville, Texas, this 
the 22nd day of April, 1944. 
(SEAL) Martin G. Davis
Clerk of the District Court, Cooke

(23-4-5-6)

T h e  M u e n s t e r  E n t e r p r is e
‘‘The Family Paper.Serving Cooke and Montague Counties

PUBLISHED EVERY FRIDAY— MUENSTER. COOKE COUNTY, TEXAS

CLEANING & PRESSING 
SHOE REPAIRING

Nick Miller

R. N. Fette, Publisher, Now In The Armed Services 
Emmet Fette, Man aging Editor 

Rosa Driever, News Editor
S.M. Duffey of Fort Worth vi­

sited Mr. and Mrs. Don Cooke 
Friday.Entered as second-class matter December 11, 1836. at tbe post office 

at Muenster, Texas, under tbe Act of March >, 1878.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES
County, Texas

In Cooke County. . . .  

Outside Cooke County Citation by Publication
THE STATE OF TEXAS

To: John A. Culberth Defen­
dant. Greeting:

You are hereby commanded to 
appear before the Honorable Dis­
trict Court of Cooke County at 
the Court House thereof, in Gain­
esville, Texas, at or before 10 
o.clock A M. of the first Monday 
next after the expiration of forty 
two days from the date of the Is 
suance of this citation, same be­
ing tire 12th day of June A. D. 
1944. then and there to answer 
Plaintiff’s Petition filed In said 
Court, on the 26th day of April 
A.D. 1944, in this cause, number­
ed 14082 on the docket of said 
court and styled Alice Culberth 
Plaintiff, vs. John A. Culberth 
Defendant.

A brief statement of the nature 
of this suit is as follows, to wit

A suit for divorce from the 
bonds of matrimony for the rea 
son of more than three year's 
abandonment of plaintiff by de­
fendant. for the care and custody 
of the minor child of plaintiff 
and defendant tonut. Carl Arthur 
Culberth. a boy now nine yeats of 
age. for costs of suit and for gen­
eral and special relief, as is more 
fully shown by Plaintiff s Petit­
ion on file in this suit.

The officer executing this pro­
cess shall promptly execute the 
same according to law. and muke 
due return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my 
hand and Seal of said Court, at 
office in Oainesville. Texas this 
the 26th day of April AD . 1944.

(SEAL* Attest
Martin G. Davis. Clerk 

District Court. Cooke Co. Texas.
•24-5-6-7)

The life of your car, truck or tractor need not 

be reckoned in years, or even by so many miles.
Any erroneous reOectton upon the character, standing or reputation of 

any person, firm or corporation thut may appear in the columns of The 
Enterprise will be gladly and fully corrected upon being brought to tbs 
attention of the publisher.

Keep those vehicles in trim shape by going to
J.M. Huckaby survey. Abstract 
No. 1382. described as follows:

BEGINNING at the NW cor­
ner of said survey:

THENCE South with the West 
line of said survey 339.3 varas to 
the NW corner of a 45.78 acre 
tract described in an oil and gas 
lease from W.E. Meador to Kay 
Kirn bell dated September. 27.1943 
and recorded in Book . page 
of the Deed Records of Cooke 
County, Texas:

THENCE East with the North 
line of said 45 78 acre tract 359 
varas to its NE corner and to an 
agreed line as evidenced by an 
agreement between J.M. Huckaby 
and G E. Miller recorded In Book 
63. naKe 370 of said Deed Records, 
said point being 112 varas West 
of the Southeast comer of said 
Huckaby survey:

THENCE N o r t h  with said 
! agreed line 339.3 varas to the 
( North line of said Huckaby sur­
vey;

THENCE West with the North 
line of said survey 326 varas to 
the place of beginning 
by virtue of the claim and inter­
est therein that is being asserted 
by the defendant Amanda Rob­
erts O Rourke as an alleged heir 
of Rebecca Land, deceased, and 
her husband. Pat O'Rourke, and 
to establish the title and owner­
ship of said 20 58 acres of land, 
and to partition said land, and 
for the appointment of a Receiver 
in connection therewith to sell the 
same, and In which it is alleged 
that the plaintiff W E  Meador 
owns an undivided 93-720 Inter­
est in said land and In addition 
Is entitled to a contribution of 
$24 08 from the other owners for 
delinquent taxes against said 
land in the amount of $2766 
wipch he was compelled to pay. 
and for which he has never been 
reimbursed: the plaintiff I .aura 
M. Lewter owns an undivided 90- 
720 interest in said land, subject 
to her part of said taxes paid by 
the plaintiff W E  Meador, that 
the defendants Fannie Marshall 
Cunnineham M a u d  Marshall. 
Pay Marshall Thom. Eddie Mar­
shall Cunningham. Verna Coffey. 
Carmen Marshall Stiles. Myrtle 
Touchton and B W Marshall 
each own an undivided 1-720 in­
terest in said land, subject to

Ben Seyler Motor Company
Muenster

May 5. 1939
Muenster has rural electrifica­

tion. -----  Mrs. Magdalena Streng
78, dies after several month's ill­
ness. -----  Death claims Mrs. P.J.
Klimp, 62. -----  New still to be
added to Muenster Refinery: wjll 
more than triple capacity: stor­
age capacity also to be Increased.
----- Lindsay is host U> Catholic
League in district meeting. -----
Nick Yosten home destroyed by
fire Wednesday morning -----
Oolden Jubilee Flower Show- 
opens today. -----  Another at­
tempt to legalize beer in county
is under way. -----  Marriage, last
week, unites Frank Schilling and 
Caroline Streng, and Richard 
Wilde and Clara Lutkenhaus. — 
— Mr. and Mrs. F A , Kathman 
are parents of a son. their first 
child. ----- Throat Infection prov­
es fatal to Infant son of Mr. and
Mrs. George Qehrtg -----  M i*
Dorothy Fette represents Muen 
ster as duchess at Oainesville Cir­
cus and Homecoming. -----  City
installs new booster pump.

MotUentf-Jjbay Is May 14thAt last a way to end all wars— 
let the whole world agree not to 
have another one until this one is 
paid for.

Freedom of rpeech is enjoyed 
by both married and single men. 
but the single men enjoy more 
of It.

Mothers —  Keep up morale with a 
new hairdo. This is your day— Look 

Your Best!
Helen Curtis Oil Wave $8
COLD WAVE $10 up

SPECIAL THIS WEEK 
REALISTIC OIL 

PERMANENT WAVE *
ThU solution gives a soft beauti­
ful wave and la recommended for 
hair that is hard to curl. It la 
easy to keep looking good.Unless Your Clothes 

Look Their Best.
Prices on all Permanents Inc lude Shampoo. Set and Choke

of HairstyleLone M a r  
C leaners
J. P. CJOSUS. Prop 

rte 831 (ialne*tills
RHODA ANN BEAUTY SHOP

319 N. Red River St- Gainesville

Welcome the

DAIRY BARNS 
HEN HOUSES 

IMPLEMENT SHEDS

We have plenty of BOXING, SHIP LAP, 

CENTER MATCH and DIMENSION LUMBER
Interesting WEAVES 
Becoming BRIMS, 
CROWNSAlso other building materials. Let us figure with you 

Estimates gladly given

Get your felt hat o ff to the cleaners, 
then store it away for next fall and 
winter! But this‘ summer, relish the 
cool comfort of a fine, shape-holding 
straw, such as these. Light and dark 
colors; wide and narrow bands; sty­
les becoming to all.

MOUND C IT Y  
P a in t  and Varnish

THE M AN ’S STORE

Manhattan ClothieisC. D . Shamburger Lumber Co
Jerome Pagel, Mgr. GainesvilleLeo M. KuehnMuenster

r
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MEET '

mme
AMERICA

Niim itr 10 le e w in  or ik r  
toumlritt «/ Middle dm trite

GG^Q'iJQ
HAITI. 50 Ml SOUTHEAST Of CUBA,WITH All 
ABEA o r 10.204. 50 Ml., IS ABOUT THE SIZE Of 
MAC /LAND J HAS 3 MILLION POPULATION

Political

Announcements
The following persons have 

authorized The Enterprise to an 
nounce their candidacies for pol­
itical offices, subject to the Dem­
ocratic primary election, July 22, 
1944.

For Congress, 13th District:
GEORGE MOFFETT, Hardeman 
County.

For District Judge:
BEN W. BOYD

< Reelection >

For District Clerk:
M ARTIN  G. DAVIS

i Re-election)

For County Judge:
CARROLL F. SULLIVANT 

4 Reelection •

For Commissioner Prec. 4:
J. E. <Earl) ROBISON 

i Reelection >

For Commissioner Prec. 3:
J. R. 'Robert) LITTLE

< Reelection)

For Sheriff:
i

FLOTSAM Town O W  COcOn* in
HAITI A HP HOST EUOOPEAN *0«T IN 
NESTE RN WORLD tfCBi Su ilT AT
petit  a h s e  raoM  rue w ittCKAoe
OF COLOMBO* SMF'SAMTA 
MAB1A m

cam «*/ n t rum r  amku.tumi
ha  t, AMHuALLT E4P0BTS IE MILLION 
L0S or S  SAL I HEMP) TQ AMESlCAW 
HOPE MANIAS

O. B. W INTERS 
CARL WILSON 

i Reflection >

For County Treasurer:
MRS, EVA O. TOWNSLEY 

i Reelection >

WANT ADS

S C L F - A ‘ I P £  M A M !  TOOSSAIHT ip w iO T U B f
Li,if. re L M  S L A V ie v  TO BECOME A GCM EBA l
*n  TfT tofhch  A S M y - ifp  tm*  o evo lt  w h ic h
E . TD IN NAiT *  LBEPAnON A POM fBAHCE

Difference* In language are no 
barrier to economic and politi­
cal cooperation among the In­
terdependent American repub­
lics. Haiti (peaks French, the 
other Middle American coun. 
tries Spanith, Branl Portu­
guese. the United State* fcng. 
llsh. But, all speak the Ian- 
puage of democracy. A small 
but Important member of the 
United Nation*. Haiti he'p* the 
war effort by producing rubber, 
bearing plants, *le*l, auger, ha. 
nanae. tannin, and caetor oil 
(a lubricant for highflying 
plane*),

FOR SALE 7 foot binder. Good 
Condition Prank Schilling. Mucn 
ster. 23-2

LOST Box of hand tools con­
taining 3-8 to 2 inch sockets, etc., 
between John Fette Ranch and 
Muenster city district. REWARD. 
Ralph Richards. Muenster 23-2

FOR SALE: At Fred Salmon!
Ranch, 3 miles north of Nocona, 
49 one, two and three year old 
ewes with lambs by side. Most 
lambs born December and Jan­
uary. Sheep are in good condition 
and well cared fox'. Also have 6 
bucks, 12 wethers and 30 dry ewes 
Reason for selling —  woves are 
getting them. 23-1

TRACTOR OILS & GREASES. 
Gainesville’s most complete parts 
and Accessory store. A lot of 
things you can't find anywhere 
else. Kenyon Auto Store, Gaines­
ville. Texas Dan Kenyon. Mgr.

45-tf

FOR SALE 40 head young, re­
gistered Hampshire sheep. 751b. 
lambs $20. with papers. One to 
three year old ewes with lambs. 
Priced to sell. Write or see Orth 
Youell, Stoneburg, Texas. 20-tf

FOR SALE: Divan, opens to 
double bed, complete with mat­
tress at half price. Mrs. Johnny 
Otto, Muenster. 5-1

FOR SALE: Red River Special 
28 threshing machine. A - l shape. 
Belts and pulleys all working. See 
A1 or C.M. Walterscheid, Muen­
ster. 24-2

FOR SALE: 8 foot Case binder, 
on rubber. A - l condition. J.H. Ba 
yer, Muenster. 24-1

FOR SALE: 7-foot McCormick
Deering binder; Farmall M trac­
tor; 22-36 McCormick Deering 
tractor and hog feeder. J.B. W il­
de, Muenster. 24-2

FOR SALE: 8 Jersey heifers at 
John Bayer’s auction sale Sat­
urday. 24-lp.

I  have for sale a stock farm 
improved, about half in cultiva­
tion, half in grass: located south­
west of Muenster. See me for par 
ticulars. Reece A. Hays, Gaines­
ville, Texas. 24-2

= »

EXPERT WATCH and 
JEWELRY REPAIRING

A. R. PORTER
104 N. Commerce —  Gainesville

FOR SALE Good Ouernsey 
milk cow. Ann 'W ilde) McDaniels! 
Muenster. 23-2p ‘

FOR SALE: 6 foot McCormick 
binder. See Dude Rosson, Rt. 2. 
Muenster. 23-2p

WANTED Used Cars without 
tires. Need more Junk. Have used 
parts for sale. J.P. Flusche, Muen­
ster. 50-tf.

STRAYED Bay horse. 9 years 
old, 16 hands, wart on left ear; 
Sorrel horse. 7-years old. scar on 
wethers; and one black mare 
mule. Notify Sam Tuggle. Rt. 3. 
Muenster. or E M. Faught. Argyle 
Texas. 24 2p

FOP. SALE 177 1-2 acre farm 
4 miles southwest of Valley View. 
120 acres in cultivation On gra 
vel road. REA line. School bus by 
farm Oood black land. Good im­
provements. E. L. Malllcote Val 
ley View. 24-2p

Clyde W . Tetter D.D.S
G e n e r a l  P r a c t ic e  o f  I V n l U l r y  

DENTAL X HAT 
SAINT JO. TEXAN

'W ANTED Olr! for housework 
and care of child. See Mrs. Em­
met Curtis. Qainesville. 20-tf

FOR GOOD USED CARS see 
> t u t  old reliable Chrysler and Ply - 

' aouth dealer and save money. 
Ben Seyler, Muenster. 51-tf

FOR YO t'R  A l'TO  PARTS 

TRY KENYON A l ’TO STORES 
Gainesville. Trxaa 

flattery Recharging IVr

---Job Printing
—  Of the Highest Class

T h e  M u e n ste r  K nterprise

.

Older Can Need Better Care

Keep Yours at its Best

LUBRICATE WITH WEAR FREE MOBILGREASE

Your Friendly Magnolia Dealer

Magnolia Service Station
Ervin Hamric, Prop. Muenster

VASSAR CLASS OF 1966— THANKS TO GRANDMOTHER'S WAR BONO!’

THETHR
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OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF THE CONDITION OF

The First State Bank
OF GAINESVILLE, TEXAS 

AT CLOSE OF BUSINESS APR IL  13, 1914

RESOURCES

Loans and Discounts ....................... , ................ $251,665.64
Banking House ..........................     7,000.00
Customers' Bearer Bonds for Safekeeping 46.925 00
AVAILABLE CASH
Bonds and Securities ............. $2,548,356.94
Cash and Due from Banks................1.133,319.04

3.681,675.98
TO TAL $3,987,266.62

LIABILITIES

Capital Stock ........................................................  $ 65.000.00
Surplus and Profits ...............................................  52,749.67
Reserves ......... - ............................................................ 25,290.36
Customers’ Bearer Bonds Deposited .......................  46.925.00
DEPOSITS ......... - ....................................................  3,797,301.59

TO TAL ...............................  $3,987.266152

OFFICERS

F. MORRIS, JR., Pres. 

CLAUDE JONES, Vice Pres. 

WM. LEWIE, Cashier

DIRECTORS

F. Morris, Jr.
Claude Jones 

J.J. Raiser #
Wm. Lewie 

E.M. Thompson

Second Oldest State Bank In Texas

j j # ,

With her sons serving in the various branches of the 

Service, and her daughters lending a hand on the home 

front, what gift is more fitting than something to speed 

and lighten her work, or make her leisure hours more en­

joyable.

Western Auto  Associate Store
112 E. California Phone 1507

Gainesville, Texas

DISHES 
GLASSWARE 

NEST of CHAIRS 

CUTLERY 

PYREX

COFFEE MAKERS 
LAW N CHAIRS 

DESK LAMPS 

BAGGAGE 

UTILITY CANS .
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DR. A. A. DAVENPORT
CHIROPRACTOR 

OFFICE HOURS 9 12 —  1-6 
And By Appointment
201 Pyhlan Building 
Telephone —  100

Be Patriotic!
Save tires and gasoline by 
attending the local theatre.

Relax Theatre
Muenster

May 5 thru 12 

FRIDAY

/Andy Hardy’s 
Double Lite*

With

Mickey ROONEY 
Louis STONE 

News & Cartoon

Lindsay News

Mis. John Neu went to Gaines­
ville Monday as a patient for an 
operation at M <fc S hospital.

Rev. Conrad Herda was in 
Muenster Tuesday morning for a 
visit with the pastors of that city.

Pvt. Lambert Beyer of Fort 
Sam Houston is here to spend his 
furlough with his mother, Mrs. 
Adam Beyer, and other relatives.

Saturday
DOUBLE FEATURE

Getp AUTRY
»  IN

'The Big Show*
with

Smiley BURNETTE 

And

Northwest Rangers
James CRAIG 
Patricia DANE 

Jack HOLT

Serial “ FLYING CADETS”

Sunday & Monday

'A  Lady Takes A
Chance'

Jean ARTHUR 
John W AYNE

I’ lus News

’The M a rin e s at Tarawa’

In Technicolor 
and Cornedv

Walter Bezner of Cameron was 
here for a weekend visit with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. John Bez­
ner and family.

Ralph Bezner was recently 
transferred from the army air 
corps to the regular army. He is
still confined to the hospital at 
Bringham City, Utah.

Miss Florene Arendt spent the 
weekend at Muenster with her 
sister, Mrs. Emmet Fette and fa­
mily.

Mike Neu. son of Mrs. J.F. Neu. 
stationed with the Navy at Seat 
tie, Wash., last week received a 
promotion and is now a seaman 
first class.

Approximately 2 inches of rain 
fell here Saturday morning ben- 
ef it ting spring oats. corn, gardens 
and pastures. Crops in this sector 
look fine.

Lawrence Zimmerer. who under 
went a major operation at Sher­
man two weeks ago. was brought 
home Sunday and is making a 
normal recovery.

Tuesday Si Wednesday

/There's Something 
About a Soldier*

Tom NEAL 
Evelyn KEYES

Thursday & Friday

'Heaven Can Wait'
Don AMECHE 

Gene TIERNEY 
In Technicolor

_____ Comedy & News
^ R B v i a m n r

Sgt. Frederick Schmitz, aerial 
gunner with the army was given 
an overseas assignment some 
time ago. Previously he was sta­
tioned in New' Mexico. He is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. John Schmitz

Sgt. Raymond Kupper. who has 
been stationed with the army at 
Camp Butner. N.C., was recently 
called for overseas duty. He Joins 
two brothers overseas. Pvt And 
rew Kupper and CpI Michael 
Kupper. The boys are sons of Joe 
Kupper.

Mr and Mrs Laval Kinsley and 
daughter. Patsy, of Borger arriv­
ed Sunday for a two week* visit 
with her parents, the Frank 
Mages, and other relatives Kin- 
slev will begin his training In the 
Navy the latter part of this 

i month Hts wife la the former 
Miss Jane Mages.

. a*
Mrs. Bruno Zimmerer and her 

I sister. Miss Elsie Louise Bezner 
were both In Dallas Friday for 
dental operations They were ac- 

. companled back home by their 
sister. Mrs. Leo Cutala and child­
ren to spend the weekend Mr 

1 Cutaia arrived to accompany his 
family back to Dallas Sunday.

•
Pvt Eddie Mages, son of Mr 

and Mm. Frank Magea. who has 
been overseas with the army. In 
England and Ireland Is back in 
the states and will arrive home 
this week, according to reports 
He Is still suffering from an old 
leg ailment and will be a patient 
In an army hospital He called hi* 
parents from New York during 
the past weekend.

Herbert Bezner. storekeeper 3rd 
class with the Navy Sea bees and 
a veteran of the Attu invasion 
and other Alaskan operations 
has pased tests qualifying him for 
training as a naval avaltor and Is 
awaiting his call. He is the son 
of Mr and Mrs John Bezner, and 
ha* been stationed at Camp 
Parks. Calif., since returning to 
the states in January of this year

GEORGE SPAETH HONORED 
ON 70TI1 BIRTHDAY

George Spaeth was honored 
with a dinner party Sunday at

Does It Pay To Feed Hogs?
Convince yourself by  reading this record
Ted and Tommy Gremminger. two local 4-H 

Club boys bought 4 shoata, weighing 113 pounds
each on Feb. 18, 1944 .................................. $36.00
Feed bought retail at Muenster Mill ........... 54.80

Total Expenditure ..............................  90.80

Hogs were sold on April 14,1944, at County
4-H Show, weighing 250 lbs. each ..............  140.00

Net profit .........................................  49.20

Or clear profit on each hog .........k........  $12.30

If hauled to Fort Worth Market, deducting 
all expenses, each would have cleared -+10.05

These shoats were castrated, fed one week on 
feed containing Hog Special to worm, then fed feed 
manufactured by Roy af Muenster Mill. Their daily 
gain was 3 pounds each. Showing a if ice profit.

Sworn records support these statements

Muenster Milling Company
R. R. ENDRES

— ■ 1 _______

Hot Suds, Clean Towels, Banish Dishwater Bacteria

k : i

The easy way with dishes Is the 
systematic way. Scrape, rinse and 
stack dishes In an orderly arrange­
ment. Use 2 dish pans or 1 disbpan 
and drain basket unless you have a 
divided sink with stoppers. In one 
pan have hot, sudsy water. Keep 
boiling water at hand for rinsing.

1

The number of acquaintances 
any person can name will sur­
prise him. The additional number 
he can’t name would astound him

It all makes a person wonder
whether our highly complex and 
super efficient system of regula­
tion is the best solution to our 
emergency. I f  given more free­
dom in deciding how to help win 
this war, perhaps the American 
public would have voluntarily 
assumed an adequate responsibil­
ity — one that would nave ac 
complished more than the regul­
ations. We ll never know the an­
swer to that one, but we’ll always 
wonder.

T e x a s ' F t  m i s t

Wash glasses first; a dish mop Is 
handy for cleansing inside them.

m
Silver should bo thoroughly 

wssbed, rinsed and placed on a fold­
ed towel, or pad to avoid scratching. 
Kitchen silver msy be placed In the 
drain basket or rinse pan.

11 y c’ OU can t da business with dishwater bacteria. They don’t understand polite hints. Banish them!"
That’s the advice to housewives given by Marjorie Griffin. Home Editor of Capper s Farmer, a publi­

cation of national circulation.
• sparkling china and gleaming silver may be beautiful home* to many families, even unto the millionth 

generation at bad little bacteria.”  writes Miss Griffin. ' The gentle hints of half-way dishwashing Just encour­
age the squatters. They thrive and multiply In lukewarm water, on dishcloths and dish towels.

•They'll go on making themselves at home, spreading colds and other contagious diseases until their un­
willing hostess puts an end to them.

• if she’s w ise, she ll use plenty of hot, sudsy wster, the cleanest of clean dishcloths and towels and scald­
ing water. She will change the water before It gels cold and gray.”

Students at Washburn University who studied supposedly clean dishes under a microscope found colonies 
of bacteria- all descendants from early settlers left living on a cup washed by ordinary methods.

Stick-to-Y our-Ribs 
Dish Is Appetizing

frankfurter farina dumplings with 
sanerkraut. pictured above. Is a  
geod down l»-earth, atl< k-lo-v our-ribs 
main di«h. says the Country reeking  
editor nf Capper’s Farmer. 1  publi­
cation of natienal circulation.

This dish hat lots of what It takes. | 
including vitamins In the fortified 
marge nne and enriched farina. 
When buying cereals, margarine and 
other foods which are available with 
vitamins added, be sure to check that 
those you get are the enriched ones, 
advises the Capper's Farmer expert

Dumpling* with Hanerkrsnt
IH  cap* aeM-rtstgg J Iranklurtora 

raks Soar | q< tauorkraet
4  cup rerlchcd lariaa 1 rap water 
I laklripoon* lortiSrd I largr onl-a 

margarine «  to k rlove*
l ,  tap milk

Sift and measure flour. Stir In 
farina. Cut in margarine and add 
milk. Mix lightly with a fork. Slice 
frankfurters in 4-inch slices. Add 
to dumplings, saving a few pieces 
to garnish top. Place sauerkraut in 
a large skillet with cover to At. Add 
water and onion In which cloves 
have been stuck. Bring to a boil. 
Drop dumplings by tablcspoonfula 
on sauerkraut. Garnish with pieces 
of frankfurter. Cover closely. Steam 
without removing cover 20 to 23 min­
utes. Serves 6 to 8

town guests: Messrs, and Mmes 
Wilfred Reiter. A1 Havcrkamp. 
and Andrew Schoech and thetr 
families of Muenster. Miss Agnes 
Spaeth. Fort Worth, and Misses 
Frances and Evelyn Spaeth Dal 
Us.

Only member of the family 
circle mussing was Cpl. Joe 
Spaeth stationed with the army 
in England, and he was repre­
sented by a birthday gift seht 
from Britain The honor guest 
also received a shower of gifts 
from those attending the celebr­
ation.

-----------v ---------

LINDSAY
SCHOOL TATLKR
Mary U * i* r  Berner *45

Introducing Alice Sandmann
Sweet, unassuming friendly — 

that's Alice A grin on her fare 
and a greeting on her lips. Alice 
Is a friend to everyone Sweet- 
tempered and gentle, she has ne 
ver been seen losing her temper 
Alice Is one of the best sports on 
the campus, being equally good In 
basketball and volley ball.

Although not an officer of the 
Sodality. Alice surely la a "leader 
in following” and does her full 
share to make all sodality activ­
ities. whether spiritual or social, 
successful The Sodality paid tri­
bute to Alice at a recent election 
by conferring on her the greatest 
honor of the year — that of May 
Queen. Beautiful, dignified, mo 
dent In her lovely blue net gown. 
Alice, always a true Child of 
Mary, had the great privilege of 
crowning our Blessed Mother at 
the May 8ervlce Sunday night.

Confetti—
(Continued  from  pago 1)

forms of rationing How many 
will hesitate to buy meat or shoes 
they don't need If they have the 
tickets? How many will hesitate 
to patronize the black market 
when they are out of tickets?

to the beautiful shrtne of Our 
Blessed Mother After the offer­
ing of thetr flowers, the Social­
ists Joined in an Act of Consec- 

I ration followed by the ' Hymn to 
Our Blessed Mother for Our Boys 
m 8ervtce'\ Benediction of the 
Blessed Sacrament brought the 
service to a cloae.

Hoellcer Grocery
Lindsay, Texas

T exas Theatre
Saint Jo, Texas

BACCALAUREATE SERVICE 
ON SUNDAY. MAY 7

On Sunday morning. May 7. 
at 7 30 o clock. the high school 
and grammar school graduates 
will assist at Mass and receive 
Holy Communion in a body The 
High School Choir will sing dur 
lng Mass

A breakfast In honor of Uie. 
high school graduates will be ser 
ved In the beautiful dining room 
of the rectory.

Mrs Kenneth Mitchell and son 
of Oalnesvtlle spent Wednesday 
and Thursday visiting Mrs Mar­
tin Trubenbach and fam ily .____

his home In observance of his 
birthday He was 70 years old.

The dining table was centered 
with a degorated cake and places 
were laid for the nonorcc and his 
family and the following out of

HIGH SCHOOL SODALISTS 
CONDUCT CROWNING RITE

A very impressive service in 
honor of Our Blessed Lady. Queen 
of May, was held In 8t. Peters 
Church on Sunday evening. April 
30. Awe inspiring was the proces­
sion led by Prefect Johnnie 
Arendt. carrying the Service Flag 
to remind Sodallst* to pray par­
ticularly for our boys in the arm­
ed forces, followed by all the high 
school sodallsts in uniform, and 
the May Queen. Alice Sandmann. 
with her six attendants. Marcella 
Schmitz, Rita Popp. Beatrice 
Block. Fiances Bengfort. Floren­
ce Zimmerer and Dorothy Beyer.

Thif keep figktiav- 
Yon kesp biyiagMM soma

May 5 thru 12 
FRIDAY

'Uninvited*
Ray MIDLAND 

SATURDAY

'Outlaw Trail'

Prevue Saturday Night 
And SUNDAY

'Navy Way'
Robert LOWERY 
Jean PARKER

MONDAY & TUESDAY

'The Fighting 
Seabees'

John W AYNE 
Dennis O’KEEFE 

Susan HAYWARD

Wednesday & Thursday

Woman of theTown
Claire TREVOR 
Albert DEKKER

FRIDAY

'Henry Aldrich, 
Boy Scout'
Jimmy LYDON

m  i
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“You Can't Get Blood 
Out of a Turnip"

It is simply not there. Neither can you get appet­
izing, tasty meals out of low grade, "bargain coun­
ter” groceries. If the quality and original flavors 
are not there, the patient wife simply can’t cook 
them into the meals.

The smart and economical thing to do is buy foods 
of known and proven quality, in the first place. 
That’s what hundreds of our customers are doing.

Hoelker Grocery
LINDSAY, TEXAS
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Borrow
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Bank
THEY BELONG TOGETHER —  NO 

MATTER W H AT  YOUR PROBLEM IS.

“A Good^ Bank to be With”

The Muenster State Bank
Muengter, Texas
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