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GENE KLEMENT combines a windrow of spring oats in a field south- 
west of Muenster. The Klements store the grain as feed for their dairy 
herd. 	 Janie Hartman Photo 

YOSHITAKA NAKAMURA 

W.B. ALLISON and GEORGE SPAETH 

BRET WALTERSCHEID enjoys a dip in the toddlers' pool at Muenste 
City Park earlier this week. He is the son of Kim and Lisa Walterscheid. 

Janie Hartman Photo 
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Serving Muenster 

and Cooke County since 1936 

W.B. Allison, George Spaeth 
attain Scouting's highest rank 

nears completion 
The end of harvest season in 

this community is just a few days 
away, provided that the present 
good weather continues that much 
longer. 

In general, the season can be 
described as about half the 
average yield because of the hard 
freeze earlier in the year and ex-
cessive rainfall. 

Reports by the farmers average 
about 20 bushels of wheat per 
acre. A few choice fields are mak-
ing 45 bushels but some farmers 
are cutting 4 to 5 bushels just to 
clean up t he field. 

Market prices for hard wheat, 
7" 	according to local grain dealers, is 

53.10 a bushel. The high this 

Attaining the highest rank in 
Scouting were George W. Spaeth 
and W.B. Allison, when the honor 
was conferred at St. Mary's 
Church of Gainesville on May 27, 
1990. Both scouts attended St. 
Mary's School and Lindsay High 
School. 

George Spaeth is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. David Spaeth, the 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert 
Endres of Muenster, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Henry Spaeth of Gainesville, 
and the great-grandson of Mrs. 
H.J. Fuhrmann of Muenster. 

W.B. Allison is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Allison and grand-
son of Leatha Smith of Gainesville 
and Mary Allison of Shawnee, 
Oklahoma. 

George Spaeth joined Cub 
Scouting in 1979. He joined Pack 
652 in 1980, earned the Arrow of 
Light, bridged over to Troop 659, 
sponsored by First United 
Methodist Church, in 1983. He 
has held positions of Assistant 
Patrol Leader, Patrol Leader, 
Senior Patrol Leader, Chaplain's 
Aid and Leadership Corps. 

He is a member of Order of the 
Arrow, earned the Ad Altare Dei 
and Pope Pives XII medals and at-
tended National Jamboree in Fort 
A.P. Hill, Virginia. He and his 
father are the only members of St. 
Mary's to attain Eagle rank. 

For his Eagle project he 
repaired and repainted Lindsay 

Sacred Heart Parish hosted a 
Pre-Father's Day Picnic on Sun-
day, June 10. Over 650 people 
were served a hearty dinner at 
noon. 

Carrie 	Walterscheid 	and 
Virgilla Herr were chairmen for 
the meal. The chicken was fried 
outdoors by several men of the 
parish under the supervision of 
Dan Haverkamp. 

While the adults enjoyed 
visiting and games in the com-
munity center, the children were 
entertained outside under the 
pavilion with games and an in-
teresting variety of arts and crafts. 

An auction concluded the day's 
activities. Don Flusche, Billy 
Caraway and Herkey Biffle were 
the auctioneers. 

The Main Raffle winners were 
Tracey Henscheid, Rainbow 
Vacuum Cleaner; Charlie Wim- 

ISD playground equipment. His 
future plans are to work and go to 
college. 

W.B. Allison joined Cub 
Scouting with Pack 663 in 1979. 
He earned the Arrow of Light. He 
joined Troop 659, sponsored by 

mer, 500 lb. calf; Al Walter, Oak 
Curio Cabinet; Gary J. Hess, 
Magnavox 25" Color T.V.; Albert 
A. Knabe, Magnavox 4-Head 
V.C.R; Glen Miller, hog; Bert 
Walterscheid, hog; Eleanor Sick-
ing, hog; Jerry Kindiger, Howard 
Miller clock; Ed Knauf, 5100.000 
in trade from Muenster Building 
Center; Vic Rohmer, 5100.000 

Citizens state 
feelings on 
improvements 

A public hearing was held Thur-
sday, June 7 by the City of Muen-
ster in City Hall concerning the 
proposed assessments to property 
owners abutting certain street im-
provements. The lengthy meeting 
was well attended. 

After hearing the opinions and 
facts stated by those present the 
Muenster city council voted to go 
ahead with all but two of the 
proposed street improvements. It 
was decided not to pave the south 
side of 6th Street from Hickory to 
Pecan and Hickory from Eddy 
Street to 250 feet north. 

The proposed paving of Hickory 
Street from Eddy north to present 
pavement at 220 S. Hickory was 
originally included because of two 
previous petitions by property 
owners in that area, said Joe Fen-
ton city manager. The paving 
project couldn't be included in past 
paving projects because it wasn't 
curbed on the west side. The curb 
has since been constructed on the 
property which is owned by Chuck 
Bartush, Sr. Objections from 
property owners was the reason for 
dropping the two proposed paving 
projects. 

Streets which will be improved 
with paving include 5th Street from 
Pecan to Hickory; 6th Street from 
Sycamore to Hickory; 9th Street 
from FM 373 to Cedar Street; Elm 
Street from FM 373 to 9th Street; 
and Elm Street from 9th Street to 
8th Street. 

It will probably be late summer 
before paving begins because the 
curbs must be constructed first and 
bids for the paving job have to be 
taken and a firm hired. 

First United Methodist Church, in 
1983. As a member of Troop 659, 
he was an Assistant Patrol Leader, 
Patrol Leader, Assistant Senior 
Patrol Leader, Librarian, Scribe, 
and Quartermaster. In 1987 he 
was elected by Scouts of the Troop 

Savings Bond from 1st State 
Bank; Bert Hesse, 14K Gold 
Chain and Crucifix; Ed Knauf, 
Cook-N-Cajun Electric Water 
Smoker; Gene Hess, free auto 
tune-up. 

Winners in the Children's Raf-
fle were: Laura Browning, Little 
Tykes Playhouse; Justin Hess, 
Gameboy Nintendo; Bert Hesse, 
Boy's 20" bike; Adam 
Dangelmayr, Girl's 20" bike; Jen-
nifer Hoedebeck, Custom Built 
Table and Chairs; Donald 
Walterscheid, $50.00 Savings 
Bond; Koch Engineering, Super 
Marie Bro. 3 (Nintendo Game); 
Jace Lee Koelzer, Electronic Bat-
tleship game; Collette Bayer, 
AM/FM Stereo Cassette Player; 
Neil Hesse, Raggedy Ann and An- 

to receive the Order of the Arrow. 
His Eagle project consisted of re-
painting various numbers, strips 
and flight symbols at Gainesville 
Municipal Airport, also his pro-
ject involved the design, layout 
and painting of a displaced 
threshold at the airport. He 
graduated from St. Mary's School 
in 1987, and will be a senior at 
Lindsay High School and has let-
tered in both track and football. 
His plans after high school are to 
attend college. 

Participating in the Eagle Court 
of Honor on May 27 were 
members of Troop 659, Dr. Bob 
McLeroy, Tim Money, Danny 
Lovelace, Jeff Wilhoit, Murlin 
Evans, Curtis Weems and Michael 
Lovelace. 

The Eagle Court for Spaeth in-
cluded Ralph Sidener, Dan 
Richardson and Edwin Wright. 
The Eagle Court for Allison in-
cluded Harold Beck, Dan 
Richardson and Edwin Wright. 

Others participating were David 
Wright, Bob Wilhoit, Don 
Dudley, Kyle McCain, Jim Gidley 
and Ed Wright. 

Organist for "God Bless 
America" was Patsy Henry. 
Benediction was given by Father 
Nicholas Fuhrmann, OSB, pastor 
of St. Mary's Church. 

A reception followed the Court 
of Honor. 

dy Dolls; Katie Flusche, Tiger 
Skin rug; Jason Sicking, Spy 
Hunter (Nintendo Game); Rose 
Hofbauer, "Honey I Shrunk The 
Kids" (V.C.R. tape); Leslie Crew-
ing, Fisher Price "Magic Vac"; 
Joe Knauf, Girl's Watch; Hank 
Walterscheid, Gram Bear (Care 
Bear); Laura Taylor, Interna-
tional Tractor; Matt Bayer, Super 
Star Barbie and one extra outfit; 
DeAnn Dangelmayr, L.A. Brite 
Pocket Camera; Collette Bayer, 
"Sweeter Than Honey Tape." 

Dorothy Hartman won the quilt 
raffle and Mindy Walterscheid 
won the rifle raffle. 

The chairmen expressed their 
gratitude to everyone who helped 

-those who worked, donated items 
or helped in any way. 

season was $3.28 with a the low 
price $3.06. Soft wheat prices at 
one time had a 40 cent difference, 
but at press time was selling for 
$2.80. 

Oats harvest is also being com-
pleted with the present price of 
$1.60 per bushel. 

Nocona farmers were the first 
to bring wheat to the Muenster 
elevators approximately three 
weeks ago. Locally Aloys 
Fuhrmann brought the first load 
to Muenster Mill on May 30 while 
Harold Bindel and Cyril 
Walterscheid were the first to ar-
rive at Tony's Seed and Feed 
Elevator. 

Yoshitaka Nakamura, foreign 
exchange student at Muenster High 
School, and guest for the school 
year in the home of Henry and 
Janie Weinzapfel, competed in 
Austin on Monday, June 4, at the 
state level in solo and ensemble 
band concert music. 

According to Band Instructor 
Charlotte Taylor, Yoshi did very 
well in competition. He received a 
Division III rating on a Tuba solo 
and was accompanied on the piano 
by Juanita Bright. 

He presented "Airre Bourree" 
by Johan Bach. To qualify for ad-
vancing to state competition, he 
placed on Rating I at District level 
in Wichita Falls in February. He 
also received a gold medal; only 
winners of Rating I were gold 
medal winners. 

Ms. Taylor said that judges 
comments told that "He has a great 
potential and he is a fine young 
man." The Muenster High band 
instructor added: "I am proud of 
Yoshi for his accomplishments this 
year. We have enjoyed having him 
in the Hornet Band. We will all 
miss him next year. We wish him 
well in whatever endeavor he 
chooses on his return to Japan." 

Yoshi excels at UIL Meet 

Local grain harvest Sacred Heart hosts Father's Day Picnic 

Has anyone seen Dorie's dog? 

 

Good News 
Dorie Cole lost her dog, Dorcie, 

sometime Sunday night when the 
Sheltie wandered off while Dorie 
and her family were visiting with a 
friend in the Bulcher area. 

The dog is female and looks like 
a miniature version of Lassie. 

Dorie, who is now 7, has owned 
the dog since it was a puppy. She 
received it when she returned 
home from the hospital. Dorie has 
sugar diabetes and had both of her 
legs amputated. 

The Sheltie is her constant corn- 

par-non and rides in the wheelchair 
with her. The family friend said 
that the child is lost without the 
pet. "It's her life," he remarked. 

Anyone with any information 
on the animal's whereabouts 

should contact The Muenster 
Enterprise, (817) 759-4311. The 
animal may be along Hwy. 2382 
between Tyler Bluff and Bulcher 
or somewhere in that vicinity. It is 
a very shy dog and may run if ap-
proached by other dogs. 

Jesus toured all of Galilee. He taught in their synagogues, 
proclaimed the good news of the kingdom, and cured the 
people of every disease and illness. MATTHEW 4:23 

 



Mildred Rauschuber, 85, dies 
June 6 after a lengthy illness 

WITH THE ARRIVAL of warm, dry weather, city crews have begun the repair of the many pothole problems 
of Muenster streets. Even the subject of a recent Groad Hole is filled by David Dittfurth and Chris Yosten. You 
can now ride a bit easier on Sixth Street. 

stepson, Marvin Rauschuber of 
Valley View; 30 grandchildren and 

Mass of Christian burial wa, 
held Thursday, June 7, 1990 at 
10:30 a.m. in the McCoy Funeral 
Chapel in Muenster for Mildred 
Rauschuber. She died June 6 at 
6:05 a.m. in the Muenster 
Memorial Hospital after a lengths 
illness. 

Mrs. Rauschuber was born on 
Nov. 2, 1904 in Saint Jo, Loui-
siana to Alvin and Mabel Sharp 
Denham. She married Crescencio 
Cantu in 1922 in Austin. He died 
Dec. 16, 1964. 

She moved to Muenster in 1973. 
On March 11, 1974 she was mar-
ried to Frank Rauschuber. She 
had been a teacher for 34 years. 
Mrs. Rauschuber was a member 
of Sacred Heart Catholic Church 
and a member of the St. Anne's 
Society. 

Survivors included a daughter, 
Carmen Myers of Dallas; a sister, 
Mrs. R.V. Fayle of Commerce; 
two stepdaughters, Bea Hess and 
Trudy Felderhoff of Muenster; a 

52 great-grandchildren. 
Her husband, Frank, died on 

Sept. 8, 1988. Also preceding her 
in death were her parents; her first 
husband, Crescencio Cantu; and 
step-son Alvin Rauschuber. 

Rev. Joseph Weinzapfel and Fr. 
Harry Fisher officiated for the 
funeral services. Emily Klement 
and Eric Gray provided the 
Liturgical music. The songs in-
cluded "Be Not Afraid:, 'Fill My 
House" and "Only A Shadow." 

Interment was in Sacred Heart 
Cemetery under the direction of 
McCoy Funeral Home. Serving as 
pallbearers were step-grandsons 
Mike Felderhoff, Stevie 
Rauschuber, Charles Hess, Kevin 
Hess, Frankie Rauschuber and 
Jerry Rauschuber. 

Among relatives attending the 
funeral, coming from a distance 
were her daughter, Carmen 
Myers, and granddaughters, 
Jackie Pitcher and Patricia 
McClour from Dallas. 

glanced up and caught sight of a 
long line of aircraft, 40 or 50 
planes, flying low. He was puzzled 
because he knew there should be 
no more strikes that day. The 
question was answered however, 
as the planes turned and he saw 
the big red markings on the sides 
of the aircraft. He quickly buckled 
his harness, and made this long 
remembered radio transmission: 

"Any American fighter near 
Orote Peninsula...I have forty 
enemy planes surrounded and 
need a little help." 

Then, he launched his one-man 
attack. 

In short order three enemy air-
crafts were destroyed. Manuever-
ing behind three more planes, En-
sign Webb again opened fire. Only 
four of his guns were working, but 
he was able to down two more 
planes, despite hot pursuit from 
the enemy and intense anti - air-
craft fire from the ground. 

Now his guns had quit com-
pletely, so Spider headed out of 
the fight. But, by pumping his 
chargers, four guns regained life 
and he banked around to get 
another enemy plane. Again, his 
guns quit. Again, he pumped his 
chargers. This time only two guns 
kicked in, but he was able to fire 
on two more planes before he 
headed back to the Hornet. 

Ensign Webb managed to land 
his F6F fighter even though his 
landing gear had been destroyed, 
his canopy had been shot off, and 
his goggles had been shot off his 
helmet. There were 147 bullet 
holes in his plane, but Spider was 
unscathed. The craft was rolled 
off the Hornet and buried at sea. 

For this action, Admiral Mark 
Mitscher recommended Ensign 
Spider Webb for the Medal of 
Honor, saying he "destroyed six 
dive bombers in a single fight, and 
probably destroyed two others." 
But somewhere in the chain of 
command that recommendation 
was rewritten and the fact that he 
single-handedly attacked 40 
enemy planes was left out. 

I have urged the President to 
reexamine what happened in 1944 
and determine an injustice was 
done that can now be corrected. 
Surely anyone who would risk his 
life in this way to defend his coun-
try deserves a thorough and 
careful review of his heroic 
conduct. 

Any way you look at it, Ensign 
Spider Webb is a true American 
hero, someone we Texans can be 
proud of 

111■10.01. 11■M 
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MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 
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Lube, Oil & Oil Filter Change 

• install a now Wal-Maui oil filter •Lubricate chassis 
to manufacturer's specificatkins (cars with fittings) 
• Install up to 5 quarts any oil In stock • Check all fluid 
levels •Wal-Mart safety check at no additional charge 
• For most cars and light trucks 

11.88 

op 

WAL-MART 
Tire and Auto Center 

Hours: Monday thru Saturday 8 a.m. to 6 p.m. 
Phone 688-7122 or 668-6898 

East Highway 82, Gainesville 

Covering Texas since 1896. 

Property and 
Life Insurance 

Bob Hermes 
759-4496 
Muenster, Texas 

by Lloyd Bentsen 
United States Senator 

Not all heroes get the credit they 
deserve. 
Take Fort Worth resident W.B. 
"Spider" Webb. This Texan per-
formed many acts of bravery as a 
combat pilot during WWII, 
receiving 27 awards for his service, 
including the Navy Cross. He was 
recommended for our highest 
military award, the Congressional 
Medal of Honor, following his 
daring action one summer after-
noon in the Pacific. But, the 
bureaucracy got in the way and 

Opinion of 
parents asked 
on full-day 
kindergarten 

Muenster Independent School 
District is considering a full-day 
Kindergarten program. 

Parents of three and four year -
olds may voice their opinion by 
calling the school (759-2581). 
They may call between the hours 
of 8 a.m. - 12:00 noon, or 1 p.m. -
4 p.m., Monday through Friday. 

Of the parents registering 
children for the 1990-1991 school 
year, 84 percent preferred an all -
day program. 

The School Board will be basing 
its decision on available funding, 
parental preference and enroll-
ment numbers. 

the recommendation was never 
properly reviewed. 

I was a combat pilot during that 
war, and can appreciate Spider's 
amazing story. I've asked fellow 
Texas, and World War II aviator, 
President George Bush to take 
another look at this case. Here's 
what happened. 

In June of 1944, a 24 year old 
navy enlisted man who had risen 
to become an officer, Spider 
Webb, was flying combat missions 
off the USS Hornet. All the pilots 
had put in a rough day, flying at 
least one or two four-hour strikes 
against Guam, But, late in the 
day, another strike was ordered, 
and Ensign Webb volunteered. 

Shortly after take-off he spotted 
a downed pilot, and asked permis-
sion to cover the man until help 
arrived. Descending to 100 feet, he 
dropped dye packets to assist in 
the recovery. 

As this was taking place Spider 

Coobibeied by First Baptist Clutch 

of Muenster 

C.H. Spurgeon was talking to a 
farmer who had on his barn a 
weather vane on the arrow of 
which was inscribed, "God is 
love." He said to the farmer: 
"What do you mean by that? Do 
you think God's love is 
changeable - that it veers about as 
the arrow turns in the wind?" the 
farmer answered, "Oh no! I mean 
that whichever way the wind 
blows, God is still love." 

r James 
& Shoe 

• Repair  

110 N. Commerce 
Gainesville 
668.6461 
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Always give heroes credit! 
Ready to Ride! 

the Good Deal Gang 
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Big Deals-Small Prices 

Come See'em For Your Good Deal! 
Open MONDAY-FRIDAY 8 until 7 ! 

Open SATURDAY 	9 until 5 ! 

Financing Available • New and Used Cars! 
Previously Owned 

_i  - 	•': 	41181 ,,,I.c_eQiii  

'90 Ford Taurus 
2 To Choose From 	$12,900 

Previously Owned 

- 	• 

'90 Eagle Premier 
WAS $16,900 	NOW$15,995 

Previously Owned Previously Owned 	1 

t ik.4?-1--Lv_c., r •• 	 `..--- - 

'89 Crown Victoria 
WAS SI 6,500 	NOW$15,995 

'89 Grand Marquis 
WAS SI 6,900 	NOWS1 5,495 

New Diesel E4OD Transmission 

r-, 	• i  , 	4  
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'90 Crew Cab 

F150 F150 

. 	• 	,--G,....--  .--a..-A-, 

List 	 $17,730.00 
Ford Discount 	 3920.00 
Less Rebate 	 700.00 
Less Available FMI Discount 	$1 ,400.00 

F150 351 E4OD XL7 YOUR PRICE $14,710.00 
TO005 

List 	 $14315.00 

Ford Discount 	 $1,806.00 

less Rebate 	 500.00 
Less Available FMI Discount 	 $800.00 

T0042 	 YOUR PRICE $11,209.00 

•Plus Tax, Title & License-Rebate assigned to dealer 

Drive Home Your Good Deal Today! 

Gainesville Ford-Mercury 

- 

i
.... 

I, 

1 California @ 1-35 .1 .....N 
817-665-5531 

Home of 'The Good Deal Gang" 
tv, 



SACRED HEART KINDERGARTEN "MOVIN' ON" Dave Fele Photo 
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LET US 
HELP YOU 
HEAR AND 

UNDERSTAND 

CALL 
665-3298 

B. Junna Stralman, LVN 

0011C10( Of Research 
and Davelonmen1 

• HEARING EVALUATIONS 
• HEARING INSTRUMENTS 
• REPAIR ALL MAKES 
• DOUBLE-LIFE BATTERIES 
• OPEN MON.-FRI. 9 5 

■ 

un ma x 
Hearing Instruments 
1607 Independence 

UNE Hwy. 821 
Gainesville, Texas 76252 

DO WE 
COMPETE? 

YOU BET! 
Are you thinking about a new 

car now that manufacturers are 
advertising big rebates again? 

We can beat many so-called "bargain" 
auto financing deals. In most cases, we at 
Muenster State Bank, can compete with 
factory incentive plans and give you a 
savings of finance costs and lower 
monthly payments. 

Your BEST DEAL 
is still with your 
hometown bank. 

Muenster 
State Bank 

201 N. Main, Muenster, 759-2257, Member FDIC 121 

,- 	 ,,,,,, 9 
FINA + GENESIS = BMW! To 	starter, a car 	

1-..9 , .. ,  
you could win a "Drive 

introduce our new formula for 	security package, 	 Away-Get Away" 
gasolines - the Genesis family of 	Ray-Ban driving 	, 	 vacation package. 
fuels - we've created another 	glasses, or another 	

trn 
„.17  

Vacation winners are 

exciting formula. The Fina 	valuable Fina prize 	  automatically entered 
"Formula For Fun Sweepstakes." 	Then fill  out the bottom half, drop to win a new BMW, complete 
One that adds up to you driving 	it in the sweepstakes box, and 	with CD player and a CD library, 

away in a 1990 BMW! 	 and a year's supply of Fina 
WIN THOUSANDS OF PRIZES 	 Genesis gasoline, 
INSTANTLYI Every time you visit 	 THE FUN STARTS AT FINAI Your 

a participating Fina station 	 friends at Fina have got your 
between now and July 8, 1990, 	 "Formula For Fun" game card 
you'll receive a two-part game 	 waiting for you at a participating 
card. Scratch off the area at the 	 Fina station. So enter today. You 

top to see if you're an instant 	 could start your drive to the 21st 
winner of an automatic car 	 THE FORMULA 	century in a new BMW! 

Schilling Fina 	 FOR THE FUTURE 	H & W K. 
Highway 

 a unt r 8  y K2  o r n e r 
612 E. Division 	 FROM YOUR FRIENDS AT FINA 	

W 
 

Muenster. 759.2522 Muenster, 759-2546 

iP tul'in Ts"Pi7 iirinniliN7Orst It 14.11;0117de .,`.7:r::41,....7t1,::: .: IV To'o23"s2ritee‘PitaT : 10 VA% 
1 10 NO Rig, i r. OM Om, yi yowl o du c.r.smysvates,..vos;,...01 .4ayyd., hozauwobioal azomozoini..,Geoa.mrtwydun.ly1 ,71,,,,,Itl. 1900 ..M,.11 han noses.. lisseuied 

THE 
FORMULA 
FOR FUN 

Sacred Heart Kindergarten 
has 'Moving On' ceremony 

Sew Fun! Sew Easy! Workshop to be held 

The Sacred Heart preschool and 
kindergarten had their "Moving 
On Ceremony" Tuesday, May 29, 
at 7:00 p.m. in the Sacred Heart 
Community Center. Fr. Victor 
Gillespie gave the opening prayer. 

The kindergarten followed with 
a musical presentation of 
"Goldilocks and the Three Bears" 
featuring Elizabeth Fette as 
Goldilocks, Eric Bayer as Papa 
Bear, Kelly Fetsch as Mama Bear, 
Ashley Hess as Baby Bear and a 
cast of forest animals: Aaron 
Walterscheid and Jacob Endres as 
trees; Lacy Endres and Mattie 
Sicking as butterflies; Bradley 
Felderhoff, a red bird; Johnathan 
Bayer, a bear; Tanya Hess and 
Toby Walterscheid as deer; 
Michael Bayer and Jesse Coker as 
racoons; Jeremy Yosten, a red 
bird; Kristen Yosten, Audrey Bar-
nhill and Brittany Haverkamp as 
rabbits; Matthew Grewing, a 
squirrel; and Luke Endres, an 
owl. The kindergarten concluded 
their performance by joining 
hands and singing "Friends, 
Friends, Friends." S.H. principal, 
Jack B. Murdock presented 
students with diplomas. 

The preschool students marched 
onto the stage for a musical per-
formance directed by classroom 
teacher, Pam Dangelmayr. 
Animated 	selections 	which 
covered 	themes 	learned 
throughout the year were: "Praise 
Him, Praise Him," "Under the 
Rainbow," "The Crocodile," "I 
Am Wonderfully Made" and 

"This Little Light of Mine." 
Mr. Murdock then presented 

certificates to the 1989-1990 
Preschool Class: Catherine Bar-
tush, Daniel Bartush, Mark 
Bayer, Michelle Bayer, Jack Bil-
fle, Jayna Biffle, Alicia Cochran, 
Andrew Ellis, Ricky Endres, Lisa 
Felderhoff, Karl Fisher, Jami 
Gerstberger, 	Kelly 	Grewing, 
Megan 	Grewing, 	Darell 
Henscheid, Jennifer Hoedebeck, 
Tony Koester, M.J. Moster, Tif-
fany Richey, Emily Sears, 
Elizabeth Smith, Cindy Tempel, 

Amy 	Trevino, 	Dustin 
Walterscheid and Tyler 
Walterscheid. Preschool aide is 
Kathy Berres. 

	

Kindergarten tea 	, Christy 
Hesse and Lancta Martin; accom-
panist, Ruth Felderhof f; and 
sound technician, Ernie Martin 
were presented gift of apprecia-
tion from the parents of the 
kindergarten class.. the clos-
ing prayer, led by Father Sebas-
tian Beshoner, students, family 
and friends enjoyed punch and 
cookie refreshments. 

list, under direction of Frances 
Bayer, chaplain. 

Janet Barnhill conducted the 
business meeting and read minutes 
of the district meeting. Ethel M. 
Hesse read minutes of the last 
local meeting and Rose Hudspeth 
gave the treasurer's report. 

Refreshments were served after 
close of the meeting, by Janet Bar-
nhill and Frances Bayer, to 15 
members. Lu Vogel won the door 
prize. 

Muenster PTO 
elects officers 

At the last PTO Meeting of the 
1989-1990 school year, held on 
May 22, the following members 
were elected as PTO officers for 
the upcoming 1990-91 year. 

Herkey Biffle, president; Judy 
McDaniel, vice president; Doris 
Muller, 	secretary; 	Donnie 
Hellman, 	treasurer; 	Donna 
Graham, recording secretary; and 
Rita Russell, parliamentarian. 

Denton's Dad's 
Day should 
interest buffs 

The Denton Main Street Pro-
gram will host "Dad's Day in 
Historic Denton," to be held 
Saturday, June 16, at the 
Courthouse-on-the-Square in 
Denton, Texas. 

The Highlight of the day will be 
a baseball trade card show to be 
held on the Courthouse lawn from 
12:00 until 4:00 p.m. Vendors 
and/or collectors are welcome to 
set up their tables, free of charge, 
at 11:00 a.m. on the Courthouse 
lawn. (There is a rain contingency 
plan) Beckett Publications will 
furnish all participating kids a 
free, one month old Beckett 
Baseball Publications magazine 
and will sponsor a drawing for 
two free subscriptions to Becket 
Baseball Publications. 

The main attraction will be an 
Athletic and Western 
Memorabilia Exhibit at the Cour-
thouse Museum. Athletic items on 
display are from the UNT, TWU 
and DHS athletic departments, as 
well as, individual collections that 
date back to the 1930s. The 
Western Exhibit features items 
from local rodeo personalities and 
a spur and bit collection dating 
back to the 1800s. This exhibit will 
run through August 31, 1990. 
Museum hours are 1:00 - 4:30 
p.m., Monday through Saturday. 

For historical buffs there will be 
free thirty minute tours of 
historical Denton aboard on the 
trolleys. The trolley tours through 
Denton's past will run from 12:00 
- 4:00 p.m. 

Subiaco 
students 
recognized 

Subiaco Academy, a college 
preparatory school in Arkansas, 
recognized several area students 
for their outstanding 
achievements during the school 
year in the academy's 103rd 
graduation exercises held recently. 

Ryan Gehrig received the Gold 
Medal for Excellence in Social 
Studies and an award in Christian 
Doctrine. He is the son of James 
and Cynthia Gehrig of Muenster 
and a senior this fall. 

Helmuth Koelzer was awarded 
the Gold Medal for Excellence in 
English, and awards in Spanish, 
Geometry, Christian Doctrine, 
Biology, American History, and 
for application to studies. The son 
of Wilfred and Pauline Koelzer of 
Muenster, he will be a junior at 
the academy. 

Gus Felderhoff of Muenster 
was the recipient of achievement 
awards in Geometry, Christian 
Doctrine, and for application to 
studies. He is the son of August 
and Loretta Felderhoff and a 
junior this fall. 

Steve Schmitz, son of John and 
Albina Schmitz of Gainesville, 
received an award for achievement 
in Christian Doctrine. He is a 
member of the 1991 senior class.  

by Evelyn Yeatts 
County Extension Agent 

Sew Fun! Sew Easy! will be 
given as a special program on 
Tuesday, June 19. A morning ses-
sion will be at 9:30 a.m. with the 
same program repeated at 7 p.m. 
Both will be in the TU Electric 
Building in Gainesville. 

The Sew Fun! Sew Easy! pro-
gram will feature simple sewing 
techniques and new ideas. It will 

Mrs. Armella Cler and son Tim 
Cler have returned from a flying 
trip to Fayetteville, North 
Carolina, where they visited a 
daughter and sister and family, 
Brenda and Bob Thompson and  

be of special interest to the begin-
ner or the person who hasn't sewn 
much lately. More experienced 
seamstresses will also be able to 
gain some sewing hints. 

The Sew Fun! Sew Easy! 
workshop is sponsored by the 
County Extension Office. The 
workshop, like all educational 
programs of the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service, is 
open to anyone regardless of 

Rhonda and Rob. 
They attended the high school 

graduation of Rhonda and Rob 
from Seventy First, one of eight 
high schools in Fayetteville.  

socioeconomic level, race, color, 
sex, religion, handicap or natural 
origin. 

Evelyn Yeatts, County Exten-
sion Agent, and Phyllis Aston, 
Owner of The Sewing Center, will 
be presenting the program. Ideas 
will be given that they have receiv-
ed at various programs as well as 
from their sewing experience. 

To pre-register, call the County 
Extension Service at 668-5412. 

They all 	went 	sightseeing 
together from Sunday, June 3 to 
Friday, June 8. There are two 
military bases in Fayetteville, 
Pope Air Force Base and Fort 
Bragg. 

New ways 
to express the 
feelings you 

have everyday. 
200 Different Designs 

■ 

D DUSTIN'S 
Office Supply and Hallmark Shop 

Johnny and Mary Lou LerN.Nh 

0.1.E 	 105E Calllornla.G•IneeN111,065550a 

The VFW Auxiliary Post 6205 
received a warrant designating 
Frances Bayer as installing officer 
for the May 21 installation of of-
ficers. Accordingly, she conducted 
ceremonies for 1990-1991 officers 
as follows: Janet Barnhill, presi-
dent; Jaci Bilderback, senior vice 
president; Josephine Schilling, 
junior vice president; Rose 
Hudspeth, treasurer; Frances 
Bayer, chaplain; Juanita Knabe, 
guard; Linda Knabe conductress. 
Also Agnes Hesse, Lucille Hesse 
and Ida Mae Bindel, one, two and 
three year trustees, respectively. 

Also appointed were Ethel M. 
Hesse secretary; Julie Cunn-
ingham banner bearer; Mary Lee 
Hennigan flag bearer; Ida M. 
Bindel, Hilda Sicking, Sue Wider 
and Lu Vogel, first, second, third 
and fourth color bearers, respec-
tively; and Agnes Hesse, patriotic 
instructor and Americanism 
chairman. 

• Reports on Loyalty Day were 
read by Frances Bayer. Linda 
Knabe gave Youth and Safety 
reports. Cards were signed and 
sent to local persons on the sick 

VFW Auxiliary installs 
new 1990-91 officers 

Two attend graduation in North Carolina 
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MRS. BRADLEY CHARLES SMITH 
nee Meredith McDaniel ... 

MRS. KERRY MAC EASLEY 
... nee Anne Margaret Rumelhart 

filled 

arca nuely , 

6 rapidly 	 i • ' a 

Muenster 
Pharmacy 

Medical Center Building 

817 759-2833 

4fitoe 1N51E 
apEcim, To L112) 

Food 
Locker S2ofbauer' 

ire ifiDie EE4fi 

+104.VNU1ER8 
JIAIAE 18-23 

3ior $1.00 Hot Dogs on 
Friday and Saturday Coke 	 MR.. 2liter bottle 990 

BREAST OF CHICKEN 
Tuna 	- 	 '4 	6 Oz can 49c 	

Free Video Rental with 
$30.00 Purchase 

Coloring Contest 

Drawing for Free 
Movie Tickets 

elm win 

DUNCAN HINES 
Cake Mix 	 

CLASSIC DELIGHT 

Ice Cream 

	 V2 gal. $2 59  

Clown with Balloons and 
Lemonade on Fri., June 

22, and Sat.. June 23 18 oz. box 99° 

"I  	 lb. 39° 	
7,ts, 

Open 6 Days a Week 	Mon.-Sat. 7:30 a.m.- 7:00 p.m. 	405 East Division 	Muenster, Texas 

Lettuce 	 
JUICY 
Tomatoe" 

... 2 heads for 51 00  

P 0 

Early Ilan n speed op wit labulous• 

footwear by Connie Sport You can't 

go wrong this Spring it you catch the 

Caribbean sprit of the dramatic 

collection. Eastern Influenced colors 

include Mae and p• , • , .32.0 

Spice'y 

The Shoe Rack 
213N. Men, Upetdn Old Niers Mall 

Mu•nsim, 817 - 759 -4281 

AT 

Hofbauer's 
Food Locker 

11 405 E. Division Hwy. 82 
Muenster, Texas 

Friday, June 22 

S 	inc. 

Group charge 
99' per person 

FOR CREATIVE COLOR PORTRAITS 

granddaughter oi Maryarei 

...gb her marries in Ruda, Jx. 
Anne Margaret Rumelhart and 

Kerry Mac Easley were united in 
marriage in Santa Cruz Catholic 
Church on Saturday, May 26, 
1990 at 7:30 in the evening. 

The bride is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Max R. Rumelhurst of 
Buda, Texas and the grand-
daughter of Mrs. Margaret Fisher 
of Muenster and the late John A. 
Fisher and Mrs. Al Rumelhart of 
Metaline, Washington. The 
groom is the son of Mrs. Annie 
Easley of Raceland, Louisiana 
and Mr. Jess Easley of Minden, 
Louisiana. 

Officiating the Nuptial Mass 
and double ring ceremony was the 
Reverend Leopoldo Reyes of 
Lockhart. Music was presented by 
keyboardist Kathy Shipp of Dallas 
and harpist Mary Tryer of Shagrin 
Falls, Ohio. Lectors for the wed-
ding liturgy were Paige Pickens of 
Houston and Greg Belcher of 
Amite, Louisiana. A reception 
followed at the home of the 
bride's parents. 

Elizabeth 	Rumelhart, 	the 
bride's sister of Austin, was maid 
of honor and Rob Mahoney of 
Austin was the best man. Ushers 
were Dennis O'Bryant of Dallas, 
and the bride's brothers, Matthew 
Rumelhart of Houston and John 
Rumelhart. 

Members of the house party 
were: sisters of the groom, Linda 
Roach of Baton Rouge, Loui-
siana; Martha Novosad of 

Midlothian; Christine Chumley of 
Houston; Jeanette Galloway of 
Wichita Falls; and Mary Thomp-
son of Iowa Park. 

The bride was wearing the same 
wedding gown her mother wore 36 
years ago, an original of white 
chantilly lace and tulle over satin. 
The bateau neckline was outlined 
in appliqued petals of the lace and 
embroidered with seed pearls; the 
sleeves were long and tapered. The 
bouffant skirt had a lace over-
skirt, the back interest being rows 
of tulle ruffles falling to a demi -
sweep train. Her circular veil of il-
lusion was attached to a crown of 
flowers and seed pearls. She car-
ried an arm bouquet of wild 
flowers. 

The bride, a graduate of the 
University of Texas, is a project 
engineer at The James River Cor-
poration. The groom, a graduate 

of Louisiana Tech, is currently a 
student at Louisiana State Univer-
sity. The couple will reside in 
Baton Rouge, Louisiana. 

Among the out-of-town guests 
were Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Fisher, 
Mr. and Mrs. Butch Fisher, and 
Mr. Steven Fisher, all of 
Muenster; Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Galloway, Mr. Joel Galloway, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Fisher and 
John, all of Wichita Falls; Mrs. 
Kevin Thompson of Iowa Park; 
and Miss Virginia Fisher and 
Laurie Fisher of Denton. 

Ryan Gehrig awarded 
scholarship at Subiaco 

Meredith McDaniel became the 
bride of Bradley Charles Smith of 
Gainesville in a double ring 
ceremony in Muenster First Bap-
tist Church on Saturday, June 9 at 
5:30 p.m. Pastor Chuck Frazier 
officiated. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Robert and Judy McDaniel. She is 
a 1988 graduate of Muenster High 
School, attended Cooke County 
College where she received her 
cosmetologist's license. She will 
attend Texas Tech University this 
fall. 

The groom is the son of Henry 
K. Smith of Roswell, New Mex-
ico. He is a 1988 graduate of 
Gainesville High School, attended 
Cooke County College for two 
years and will attend Texas Tech 
University this fall. 

Before an altar decorated with 
arrangements of pink gladioli, and 
two brass, heart-shaped 
candelabras with votive candles, 
the bride was escorted by her 
father and given in marriage by 
her parents. 

For her wedding she chose a 
formal white satin mermaid gown 
designed by San Martin, fully 
jeweled and appliqued in front. 
An appliqued lace wedding collar 
above strands of pearls 
highlighted the illusion sweetheart 
neckline. Long, sheer sleeves were 
accented with cloud ruffles at the 
shoulders. The open back neckline 
was matched with draped strands 
of pearls. The fitted skirt flowed 
into a semi-cathedral train of soft, 
feminine ruffles. 

The bride carried a pearlized 
bouquet of white net puffs, white 
double ruffle gypsophilia and pink 
roses, tied with pink and white 
satin ribbons. 

Her triple-tiered illusion veil 
was held by a double strand of 
pearls and a delicate spray of tiny 
white flowers. 

ATTENDANTS 
Jennifer Chisam of Valley 

View, the bride's best friend, was 
her maid of honor. Pennye Russell 
of Gainesville and Michelle Hud-
dleston of Muenster, both friends 
of the bride, were bridesmaids. 

They were attired in pink satin 
gowns with fitted bodice, 
sweetheart neckline, short puff 
sleeves, bubble skirt over straight 
skirt with a bow on the front. 
They carried long stem pink roses 
tied with silver ribbons. 

Nicole Roberts of Gainesville, 
daughter of Ken and Pam 
Roberts, friends of the bride and 
groom, was flower girl. Logan 
Smith of Farmersville, son of 
Dennis and Charleen Smith, 
nephew of the groom, was ring 
bearer. 

Darin Allred of Gainesville, 
best friend of the groom, was best 
man. Mike Smith of Gainesville, 
groom's brother, and Paul 
Scholfield of Gainesville, friend of 
the groom, were groomsmen. 

Ushers were Brad McDaniel of 
Muenster, bride's brother, and 
Tony Perryman of Muenster, 
friend of the bride, and Jody 
Richardson of Wichita Falls, 
cousin of the bride. 

Candlelighters 	were 	Brad 
McDaniel and Jody Richardson. 

Musical selections included: 
"Lost In Your Eyes," "When 1 
See You Smile," "I'll Be Loving 
You Forever" and "When I'm 
With You." 

Stephanie Lindsey was pianist. 
Friends of the bride, Amber 
Anderson and Stephanie Bynum 
sang "Household of Faith" dur-
ing the lighting of the Unity Can-
dle. Regina Criswell sang "Here 
And Now" after the giving-away 
ceremony. 

RECEPTION 
A reception followed in the 

First Baptist Church Fellowship 
Hall, hosted by the bride's 
parents. 

Securing guest signatures in the 
bride's book were Juline Bartel of 
Muenster and Peachy Switzer of 
Gainesville, both friends of the 
bride. 

The three tiered white wedding 
cake was trimmed in pink, and 
was placed over a lighted foun-
tain. A keepsake ornament on the 
top layer was a bride and groom 
Precious Moment figurine. 

The double heart chocolate 
groom's cake was inscribed with 
the bridal couple's names. 

Amy Davidson and Jane Kle-
ment, friends of the bride, served 
the wedding cake and punch. 
Becky Harvill of Corinth, groom's 
sister, and Marsha Richardson of 
Wichita Falls, bride's aunt, and 
Charleen Smith of Farmersville, 
groom's sister-in-law, served the 
groom's cake. 

The reception area was 
decorated with pink and white 
balloons, and silver streamers on  

the ceiling and clusters of pink and 
white balloons with a silver heart 
in all the windows. 

Attending the wedding were 
guests from New York, Arkansas, 
Louisiana, New Mexico and 
Oklahomo, joining relatives and 
friends from Texas and Cooke 
County. 

After returning from a wedding 
trip to San Antonio, the couple 
will be at home in Lubbock. 

The rehearsal dinner was hosted 
by the groom's father at The 
Center Restaurant on Friday, June 
8 at 7:30 p.m. 

A shower was given by Wanda 
Meredith, bride's grandmother, 
and Marsha Richardson, bride's 
aunt, in Wichita Falls on May 18. 
Ladies of Muenster First Baptist 
Church hosted a shower on May 
21. On May 27 a shower was given 
by Jennifer Chisam, Carol 
Chisam, Sandra Harrell, Michele 
Huddleston and Pennye Russell. 

News of the 
Sick 

Lynn Dangelmayr is a patient at 
Denton Regional Medical Center 
where she has been placed in In-
tensive Care. Her illness includes 
tumors on both lungs. 

••• 

Kenny Walterscheid is a patient 
at AMI Denton Regional Medical 
Center. He had surgery on his leg 
Wednesday evening. 

JOE.R.DANGELMAYR 

Birthday 
celebrated 
Joe R. Dangelmayr was 

honored on his 90th birthday on 
Sunday, June 3, during a party in 
the Knights of Columbus Hall. 

A sit-down dinner was catered 
by The Farmer's Kitchen with 
Cathie and Frances Fuhrmann. 
The decorated birthday cake car-
ried a western theme, showing a 
cowboy on horseback roping a 
calf. Pictures and movies were 
made. 

Brothers, a sister, nieces, 
nephews and friends attended. 

Joe Dangelmayr was born June 
7, 1900, the third child of Joseph 
and Theresa Muck Dangelmayr. 
Joe was born in the Dangelmayr 
family farmhouse. 

759 - 4408 
in Old Theatre Mall 

Ryan Gehrig, son of James and 
Cynthia Gehrig of Muenster, has 
been awarded a partial tuition 
scholarship to attend Subiaco 
Academy, a college-preparatory 
school for boys located in 
Subiaco, Ark., for the 1990-91 
school term. It was announced 
during Subiaco's alumni reunion 
June 1-3 that Gehrig is the reds 
pient of the Coach Maus Scholar-
chip, valued at $950. The scholar-
ship is offered each year by the 
Subiaco Alumni Association. 

1- 10x13 
(Wall Photo) 

1 8x10 
2- 5x7 
2- 3x5 

16- King Size Wallets 
8- Regular Size Wallets 

Gehrig, a student at the 
Academy the past three years, will 
be a senior this fall. As a junior he 
served as National Honor Society 
treasurer, class representative, and ,,,, 
was a member of the Student' 
Council, yearbook staff, lector 
and server society, and Blue 
Arrow, a student tour guide 
organization. Recently he was 
elected senior class representation 
to the Student Council. His other 
activities include football, soccer, 
and cross country track. 
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MRS. CHRISTOPHER LOUIS BEAN 

nee Shelah Renne' Mabry 

t 

• 

Jayna Jae honored 

JAYNA ME BIFFLE 

MR. AND MRS. MARTIN KRAH1 

40th anniversary 
celebrated June 10 

Auto- 
Homeowners-Life  

FARM 
BUREAU 

INSURANCE 

Helping You Is What We Do Best. 
John Bartush, Agent 

759.4052 	 1100 E. Division  

Hillcrest Cenler 	Muenster, Texas 

Check your bank 
for its CD rates 

then check our rates. 
Currently offering: 

Alaturities •  Annual Rate' 

3 months 8.20 07o 
6 months 8.25 010 

1 1/2 year 8.30 07o 
Our "CD Plus' program offer CDs issued by commercial 
and savings banks or savings and loans. FDIC or FSLIC 
insurance up to 5100,000. No commission is charged. In 
cases where early withdrawal is permitted, a substantial 
penalty is required. But you can sell under specified 
conditions without interest penalty. For more information, 

just call or send in the coupon below. 

*sow,' to../anda, 

For more information, call today. 

Richard L. Rogers, V.P. Investments 
In Muenster, Call 759-2725 

0 Please send me further information on your "CD Plus-  program 

Narnc 	 \ ddrc, 

cal 	 SIJIL 

Prudential-Bache 
Securities 

Rock Solid. Market Wise. 
.......■■•■■■••■• 

01967 Prodennai-Bache Secun195 mersce, SPPC 

The Old Theatre Mall 

JEWELRY 

Main Street 

"Little 
Farmers" 

Collection 
(Perfect gifts for Dad!) 

Available at 

Jaitamist,  

Muenster 

TENT  S I E 
/NOW thru June 16\` 

Men's & Ladies' 
Imperfect 

Cowhide 
and Exotic 
Boots 

Start as '24" low as 	 a pair 

Men's & Ladies' 
Imperfect 

Eel Skin 
Boots 
'14995  
..................... 

Special Group of Ladies' 

Cowhide Boots $4995  

Special Group of Ladies' 

Suede Ropers $4995  

502 Field St. 	Gainesville 
665.7062 
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On May 27, Jayna celebrated 
her (actual) fourth birthday in the 
Muenster City Park. She was join-
ed by her parents, Donna and Jim, 
and her brother Jack. The party 
hosts were Donna, Jim and Jack, 
also her grandparents (Pa and 

• Butchie) Jimmy and Collette and 
Grandma LuLu Hess, her aunt 
Judy Biffle, who also shares her 
birthday on May 27, aunts Tam-
my Hess and Linda Grewing and 
cousins, Jon, Ken and Matthew 
Grewing; Greg, Julie and Eric 

FUR STORAGE 

Miller Cleaners 
329 N. Commerce 
Gainesville, Texas 

"Polarized" Fur Storage 
S&H Green Stamps , 

• Cold, Dry, Vault 

• Maximum Security 

• Totally Moth Proof 

• On Premises 

traditional wedding 

vows mark ceremony 
Shelah Renne' Mabry of 

Gainesville and Dr. Christopher 
Louis Bean of Muenster were 
united in marriage at 7 p.m. Satur-
day, June 2, 1990 at Hillcrest 
Church of Christ of Gainesville. 
Tracy Shelton, pastor, performed 
the double ring ceremony. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Alvin and June Mabry of 
Gainesville. She graduated from 
Callisburg ISD in 1986 and from 
Cooke County College with an 
LVN degree. She is employed by 
Dr. Patrick Kwan, M.D. 

The bridegroom is the son of 
Mary J. Bean of Wichita, Kansas 
and Jerry J. Bean of Wichita, Kan-
sas. He graduated from Durango 
Senior High, attended the Univer-
sity of North Texas and graduated 
from the University of Texas 
Health and Science Center at San 
Antonio as a Doctor of Dental 
Surgery. He is self-employed in a 
private practice in Muenster. 

The church was decorated with 
peach and teal gladioli, and an ar-
chway entwined with the bride's 
colors of peach and teal. Two altar 
wicker baskets were filled with 
arrangements of peach gladioli and 
teal roses and ivy. Large teal bows 
decorated the pews. 

"Annie's Song," "Evergreen," 
"The Rose," "If," "Faithful and 
True," "Sunrise and Sunset" and 
"The Lord Bless and Keep You" 
were musical selections. Soloists 
were Gregg Ross and Carla Krahl. 
Vocalists were Connie Galbunksi 
and Carla Lawson. 

Given in marriage by her father, 
the bride's gown was Victorian 
styled with a neckline of tulle lace 
with an overlay of sequins, pearls 
and satin. The train of satin 
cascaded down, flowing with 
pearls and sequins. The tulle 
fingertip veil was attached to a V-
shaped satin and pearl headband, 
with a cascade of baby's breath and 
pearls. She carried a bouquet of 
teal, peach and white roses with 
strings of pearls entwined with 
peach, teal and lace ribbon 
streamers. 

Baptism 
Hartman 

Nolan Edward Hartman, infant 
son of Ken and Rhonda Hartman 
received the Sacrament of Baptism 
in Sacred Heart Church on Mon-
day, June II at 6 p.m., with 
Father Victor Gillespie officiating. 
Baptismal sponsors were an uncle 
and aunt, Jon and Monica 
LeBrasseur. Nolan wore the same 
christening robe used by his 
sisters, Holly and Courtney. 

Both of the girls were present, 
joining their grandparents, Ed and 
Clara Endres and Alvin and 
Joanie Hartman, and their great -
grandmother, Mrs. Victor 
Hartman. 

Following the church service, 
the infant's parents hosted an 
evening meal in their home, for 
the above guests and David and 
Laurie Flusche and Katie; Shan-
non Hartman, and Mike Hesse. 

Hallmark's 
new line of 
cards premiers 
at Dustin's 
For those who want to convey 

more personal messages about 
their feelings and relationships, 
Hallmark's new "Just How I Feel" 
everyday greeting cards are 
designed to meet a variety of per-
sonal communication needs. 

"Now people don't have to wait 
for an occasion to send cards that 
express the caring feelings they 
have every day, according to Mary 
Lou Leftwich of Dustin Office 
Supply and Hallmark Gifts Shop in 
Gainesville. 

Dustin's offers 200 "Just How I 
Feel" greeting cards, the most 
comprehensive offering of per-
sonal feelings cards in the industry. 

Messages on these "anyday" 
cards are open and direct. They are 
written the way people talk and the 
cards can be used anytime, for any 
kind of feeling. 

A card that offers friendship and 
support says, "If you ever need a 
hug...my arms are always open." 
A card that opens the door of 
communication with a son or 

daughter says, "I used to think 
there could be nothing worse than 
being a teenager! Now I realize 
there is...Being the parent of a 
teenager. Thanks for putting up 
with me!" 

Other cards offer care and con-
cern during difficult times: "I 
know your decision to be a stay-al-
home mom was a difficult one for 
you to make." 

To make it easier to select the 
right card, the cards are displayed 
by seven categories: I'm Here For 
You, I'm Thinking About You, 
You Mean So Much, I'm Glad 
We're Friends, I'm Glad We're 
Family, I Love You and Let'. 
Work Things Out. 

ATTENDANTS 
Maid of honor was Judy Cox of 

Gainesville. Bridesmaids were 
Krystal Kerr of Southmayd, niece 
of the bride; Louise Mabry of 

Sherman, sister-in-law of the bride; 
and Doris Wagner of Gainesville. 
They were attired in identical teal 
satin, ballerina-length dresses. 
Bridesmaid flowers were designed 
and made by the mother of the 
bride, using the bride's chosen 
colors. 

Candle lighters were Josh 
Mabry, nephew of the bride, 
assisted by a brother of the bride, 
Dennis Mabry, and Kristopher 
Kerr, nephew of the bride, and 
Billy Kerr, brother-in-law of the 
bride. Flower girl was Jessica 
Krahl. 

Best man was Jerry J. Bean, 
father of the groom. Groomsmen 
were Scott Bean of California, Jim 
Bean of Wichita, Kansas, and Kelly 
Bean of Bark scale AFB, 
Louisiana, all brothers of the 
groom. 

Mothers of the couple lit the 
Living Candle for the Unity Can-
dle. 

Ushering guests were Dennis 
Mabry of Sherman and Billy 
Kerr of Southmayd. 

RECEPTION 
A reception in the Fellowship 

Hall was hosted by the bride's 
parents. The bridesmaids and Pat 
Kee and Susan Beck served the 
punch and cake. Debby Rice cut 
the bride's cake made by Della 
Rose Voth. The groom's cake was 
served by Melinda Smith and 
Shanna Haverkamp of Muenster, 
also made by Della Rose Voth. The 
lace tablecloth on the gift display 
table was used by the bride's paren-
ts on their wedding day. 

Guest book attendant was Missy 
Reed of Gainesville. 

Following a wedding trip to 
South Padre Island, the couple will 
reside in Muenster. Out-of-town 
guests included Mr. and Mrs. Alvin 
Suggs of Fort Worth; Gayle John-
son of Dallas; Mr. and Mrs. Neil 
Ruinsick of Valley Center, Kansas; 
Mr. and Mrs. David Penner of 
Tulsa, Oklahoma; Dr. Stephen 
Sellman of Whitewright; and Tim 
Lambert and daughters of 
Garland. 

S.N.A.P. 

Menu 
June 19 - 21 

NOTICE! Anyone interested 
In enjoying the S.N.A.P. meals 
must pre-register! To do so, call 
Mary Alice Bayer at her office, 
759.2922, between 9:30 and 10 
a.m. on Tuesday to sign up for 
Tuesday's lunch (or the day 
before for the other lunches). 

Tues. - Swedish Meatballs, 
mashed potatoes, mixed 
vegetables, 	fruit 	cocktail, 
bread, milk. 

Wed. - Manager's Choice, 
bread, milk. 

Thur. - Fish Nuggets, corn, 
spinach, fruit, bread, milk. 

Nancy and Martin Krahl of 
Valley View celebrated their 40th 
wedding anniversary during the 
Sunday Mass on June 10 at St. 
John's Catholic Church. 

The Krahls were married on 
June 5, 1950, at St. Mary's in 
Gainesville. 

Rev. Harry Fisher, pastor, was 
celebrant of the Mass and presided 
over the couple as they renewed 
their marriage vows and received 
the marriage blessing. All of their 
seven children and 13 grand-
children were in attendance. 

Damian Krahl and Lucy 
Fuhrmann did the Readings and 
Response. Alex Krahl and Emmy 
Schad read the Petitions. 

As part of the Offertory proces-
sion, soil from the Krahl farm was 
brought in thanksgiving of the 
family's livelihood provided dur-
ing the years of marriage. The 
couple's wedding Mass book from 
their Mass 40 years ago was of-
fered with the gifts of bread and 
wine. Micah Downey, Tommy 
Schad, Sara Krahl, Stephanie 
Krahl and Brenda Flusche par-
ticipated in the Offertory.  

Margie Devers was organist. 
Eddie Schad was altar boy. Henry 
Sandmann and Mary Bierschenk 
were Eucharistic ministers. 

An anniversary meal was held in 
the home of Grant and Carla 
Krahl in Valley View following the 
ceremony. Those attending in-
cluded Father Fisher; children and 
grandchildren including Lynn and 
Micah Downey; Cathy, Gary, 
Alex, Sara, Gerad and Royce 
Krahl; Elaine, E.J., Eddie, Em-
my, Tommy and Angela Schad; 
Carla, Grant, Jeremy, Jacob and 
Jessica Krahl; all of Valley View; 
Brenda, Phillip and Jacquelyn 
Flusche of Decatur; Stephanie 
Krahl of Denton; Damian Krahl 
and Lucy Fuhrmann of College 
Station. 

Cooke County Diabetic Support 
Group meets June 19 

The Cooke County Diabetic 
Support Group will meet Tuesday, 
June 19 at 7:30 p.m. in the 
Gainesville Memorial Hospital 
Conference Room. The program 
will be on "Balance In Control." 
No meetings will be held during 
July or August. 

Walterscheid; 	friends Melvin, 
Terry and Justin Hess, and Ron 
Trubenbach. 

The group went to Muenster 
Park and ate sack lunches. Cake, 
ice-cream and punch were served 
at 1:00 and gifts were opened and 
displayed. Jayna picked Barbie 
party accessories, and her mother 
baked a Ballerina Doll cake. 
Movies were made and pictures 
were taken. The children played in 
the park for an afternoon of fun. 

On Monday, May 28, she had 
"A Celebration of Life" at the 
Sacred Heart Preschool, where 
her mother brought her favorite 
snack to share with all her friends. 
The highlight of the morning was 
her life story shared with the class 
and pictures of Jayna as she grew 
up. Guests were her parents, Jim 
and Donna, and brother (a stu-
dent) Jack and her grandmother, 
Butchie Biffle and Aunt Judy. 



MR. and MRS. MARK MIDDLETON 

S.H. Honor Roll 

',trying Ptople LAE 1 oil 0.er Yews 
—10111111 . 	■eledto n of Mother, it 	 ,onII elm 

Largem ....of Class Wogs ie 	Teen 
307 So. Ca.N.G.1.5.114.405-4g12 

SEEDS JEWELERS 
WE DON'T CARE! 

w re you bought clocks, watches. diamond Jewelry. trophies, ciass rings or any kind of jewel, 

We will Fix 'ern. Repair 'em, Engrave 'em, Customize 'em and put batteries in 'ern! 

	

HAPPY 	To AM Father's and Their Families I 

FATHER'S DAY 	Rimy God's will be done In 'nor Intriti 

House calls on Grandfather Clocks! 

	

for sm.11additIon•I charge 	 —.Om> gokl and dismood•-- 

We'll make - with yourgold  -  a ladies' or gents' ring 

We sell all the above with prices as reasonable as anyone, year-round! 

JIM 

?V' 

kit Alt : r 

 

- Storewide Sale 
Hot Prices on 

Floor Covering 

Annual Summer 
Sizzler Sale 
Ends 4th of July 

15% OFF 

All Wood Floors 
All Tile Floors 

All Outdoor Turf 
All Dry 

Carpet Cleaning 

10% OFF 

All Vinyl 
All Carpet 

All Wallcovering 

MODERN 
FLOORS 
"We've got you covered" 

209 North Main, Muenster, 759-2848 Vet 

759-2248 Highway 82 	 Muenster 

Exactly What Dad Wants 
for Father's Day itTA I, 

— Landscaping Supplies — 

4 cu. ft. Peat 

3 cu. ft. Pine Bark Nugget 

2 cu. ft. Large Western Deco Bark 

50 lb. Wyoming White Rock 

4' x 8' Treated Lattice Panels 

8' Treated Landscape Timbers 

10 lb. Diazinon Insect Control 
(Covers 5,000 sq. ft.) 

Community Lumber Company 

NOW 
Reg. 11.95 8 8" 

Reg. 3.95 *2" 
Reg. 4.50 $3 5 0  
Reg. 3.95 2 9 5  

Reg. 10.95 8 9 "  

Reg. 2.99 *2" 
Reg. 14.50 81  0" 

20% 
Off 

All 

Garden  

... 	Tools 

Prices Good 
Through 
June 16 

'  it? it' iltri 	 VP? Vizir 	 'n? sir? 	 Y:% 	 St7a   

Women's Dress, Casual and Flats 

and Childreh's Shoes 

Racked For Your 
Convenience 

102 West Main, Gainesville 	 VISA -MasterCard 

665-6081 	 "The Store With The Personal Touch 	
American Express-Discover 

AV:PAMP5-::, "Z‘.4,e,45`.. 
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Davidson is A&M grad Wedding. Lid in _Arlington 

AMY DAVIDSON 
Amy Davidson, daughter of 

Charles and Alice Davidson, 
graduated from Texas A&M 
University in College Station on 
May 11, 1990 during commence-
ment exercises. She received a 
Bachelor of Arts degree in 
English. In addition, she com-
pleted the requirements of the 
Texas A&M Writing Specializa-
tion Program. Completion of this 
program certifies proficiency in 
both written and oral 
communication. 

4.3. SCHWAB III 

Schwab 
graduates 
at top 
Arthur James (A.J.) Schwab III 

son of Jim and Ruth Schwab of 
Austin and grandson of George 
and Anna Bayer of Muenster, is the 
valedictorian of his senior class at 
St. Michel's Academy. Graduation 
ceremonies were held on May 26 at 
2 p.m. Schwab received the award 
for excellence in Math and Science, 
and an award for school leader-
ship. He plans to attend the 
University of Berkeley, California, 
majoring in Engineering. Relatives 
attending his high school 
graduation were his grandparents, 
The George Bayers, and Mickey 
Schwab of Dallas, Georgia Nor-
veil, Clarence and Travis Bayer of 
Arlington and Mary Breeding of 
Lewisville. 

While at A&M, Amy par-
ticipated in intramural flag foot-
ball, basketball and softball. She 
was also active in the Wesley 
Foundation and the A&M Cooke 
County Hometown Club. 

Attending the graduation were 
Amy's parents; and Tom, Becky, 
Emily, Danny and Diana 
Felderhoff of Muenster; and Mike 
and Barbara Hazzard of 
Roanoke. Amy is the fifth 
daughter to graduate from col-
lege, and the fourth to graduate 
from A&M. Charles and Alice 
Davidson watched Becky 
Felderhoff graduate from the 
University of North Texas in 1976. 
Barbara Hazzard was a member 
of the Class of 1978 at Texas 
A&M. Pat Gilliland graduated in 
1981 and Kathy Brorsen received 
her degree in 1983 from A&M. 

Amy, a 1986 graduate of 
Muenster High School, will begin 
her graduate studies at Texas 
A&M in the fall. She has received 
a graduate teaching assistantship 
at A&M in English for the 90-91 
school year. 

The Felderhoff's spent the 
weekend with Tom's brother, 
Chris, and his family in College 
Station. 

FHA holds 
election 

The Muenster High School FHA 
recently held elections for officers 
for the 1990-91 school year. The 
results were as follows: Melissa 
Bayer, senior, president; Marcia 
Vogel, senior, vice-president; Jane 
Klement, senior, secretary; Jefflyn 
LeFevre, senior, treasurer; Cindy 
Culp, sophomore, reporter; 
Melissa Fisher, sophomore, and 
Tina Klement, junior, historians; 
Julie Hess and Jami Flusche, 
juniors, recreation leaders; and 
Michelle Hennigan, sophomore, 
parliamentarian. 

ir" 
4 

Mr. Jack B. Murdock, principal 
of Sacred Heart School, announc-
ed the Academic Honor Roll 
Students of the fourth nine weeks. 
To achieve the "Principal's" 
Honor Roll all grades must 
average 95 percent with no grade 
less than 93 percent. To be granted 
the "A" Honor Roll all grades 
must average 93 percent with no 
grades less than 85 percent. All 
students awarded the "B" Honor 
Roll must average 85 percent with 
only one grade averaged between 
75 percent and 84 percent. 

Following are the list of 
students recognized with these 
honors: 

Principal's Honor Roll 
Debbie Schmitt, Senior; Sharon 

Fuhrmann, Junior; Lisa Schilling, 
Sophomore; Jennifer Endres and 
Erica Schilling, Eighth grade; Tif-
fany Fisher, Sarina Fuhrmann and 
Stephanie Grewing, Seventh 
grade; Michael Becker and Jake 
McCoy, Sixth grade; John Bar-
tush, Jennifer Campbell, Greg 
Flusche, Bart Sicking and John 
Sparkman, Fifth grade; Valerie 
Bartush, Matthew Fuhrmann, 
Crystal Klement and Jessamy 

* F 	 TIM" ! 

Kindergarten 
class enjoys 
field trip 

Muenster 	Public 	School's 
kindergarten classes spent Tues-
day, May 22 in Gainesville for a 
field trip. They were accompanied 
by their teacher Rosemary 
Dankesreiter and mothers, Kenya 
Endres, Debbie Stormer, Gail 
Drachenberg, and Monnie Reid, 
and Dan Luke, bus driver. 

At the Gainesville Municipal 
Airport they saw several types of 
airplanes and walked through the 
hanger where repair work is done. 
Each child was permitted to sit in 
the cockpit of a plane and view the 
instruments. 

Next on the agenda was a stop 
at the Brewer Miniature Horse 
Farm where the children saw 
many champion and grand cham-
pion horses. Kent Snider told 
many interesting things about the 
horses and answered a variety of 
questions. To the delight of the 
students, each was presented with 
one of the large prize ribbons that 
the Brewer horses had won at 
competition shows. 

After a break for refreshments 
in Leonard Park the group spent 
an educational and fun-filled time 
observing the animals in the zoo. 
Later they ate sack lunches and 
spent time playing in the park. 

The 22 students were finger -
printed by Officer Lewis 
Schaflander of the Crime Preven-
tion Department. The children 
brought the forms home to their 
parents to keep as records. 

Officer Schaflander also took 
the children on a tour of the 
dispatch department where they 
saw and heard on computers how 
calls come through the police 
department. 

The last stop of the day was the 
Morton Museum. The students 
learned about many interesting 
and historical artifacts from 
around Cooke County. 

Sicking, Fourth grade. 
"A" Honor Roll 

Angela Endres, Tina Schilling, 
Kim Thorson and Amy 
Walterscheid, Seniors; Robin 
Greathouse, Junior; Vickie Bayer 
and Mark Flusche, Sophomores; 
Mandy Barnhill, Tommy 
Greathouse and Melissa Miller, 
Freshmen; Michael Gehrig and 
Donnetta Hess, Eighth grade; 
Alison Knabe and Loretta Reiter, 
Seventh grade; Brandon Bayer, 
Kern Endres, John Klement and 
Joey Martin, Sixth grade; Leslie 
Grewing, Corey Hess, Tonya 
Knauf, Jacob Luke and Paul 
Swirczynski, Fifth grade; Sheri 
Bonner, Shawna Endres, Trisha 
Endres, Aaron Hess, Laura Kle-
ment, Yvonne Martin, Angel Sick-
ing, Amanda Wimmer and Jeffrey 
Yosten, Fourth grade. 

"B" Honor Roll 
Amy Bayer, Janie Fisher, Max 

Koesler and David Rohmer, 
Seniors; Dawn Knabe, Katherine 
Vickers and Jenny Yosten, 
Juniors; Gregg Hess, Cheramie 
Moster and Jennifer Walter, 
Sophomores; Julie Felderhoff, 
April Truebenbach and Christy 
Yosten, Freshmen; Kelly Bayer, 
Amy Fisher and Brian Rohmer, 
Eighth grade; Neil Berres, Kristen 
Fleitman, Tammy Fleitman and 
Jennifer Fuhrmann, Seventh 
grade; Nicole Endres, Vanessa 
Felderhoff, Bradley Fisher, Scott 
Frost, Toby Hess, Joseph McCoy 
and Scott Poole, Sixth grade; Glen 
Dangelmayr, Jill Hess and 
Douglas Novak, Fifth grade; 
Elizabeth Fuhrmann, Jon Grew-
ing, David Hesse and Tammie 
Lopez, Fourth grade. 

Jalise Sutton and Mark Mid-
dleton were united in marriage on 
May 19, t990 at Woods Chapel 
Baptist Church in Arlington. Rev. 
Marshell Stewart of Forestburg of-
ficiated at the ceremony. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Ross and Brenda Sutton of 
Arlington. The groom is the son of 
Mrs. Doris Benoit of Rendon, 
Texas and Mr. W.H. Middleton of 
Houston. Bridesmaids were Amy 
Lasater, Charlotte Wasden and the 
groom's sister, Mrs. Darlene 

Cabal. Groomsmen were Ron 
Pennington; groom's brother, 
Carey Middleton, and the bride's 
brother, Darin Sutton. Ushers were 
the bride's brother, Brian Sutton, 
and the groom's brother, Johnny 
Middleton of Houston. The bride's 
cousin, Ricky Kerr, of Prairie 
Point and the groom's brother-in-
law, Jerry Cabal, were also ushers. 

Miss Becci Pressley of Prairie 
Point was flower girl. Ring bearer 
was Matt Benoit, brother of the 

Krahl 
Jonathan, Adam and Aaron 

Krahl proudly announce the ar 
rival of their sister, Lauren 
Elizabeth Krahl, born on June I, 
1990 at Denton Community 
Hospital at 9:08 p.m. Lauren 
weighed 7 lb. and was 20 inches 
long. Lauren Elizabeth is the 
daughter of David and Judy Krahl 

News stories for the Lifestyle 
Page should be NEW news. Please 
have your stories of birthdays, 
reunions, meetings, trips, special 
items of children's interest, etc. 
ready while they are newsy and 
current. 

WY Prescription Shop 

BELTONE 
Hearing Aid 

Batteries 

Always Fresh 

Shop the Drive-In Window 

torah your prescriptions 

and drug needs. 

WATTS' 
PRESCRIPTION SHOP 
302 N. Grand 	Gainesville 

665-3438 

groom. Juanita Cote of Prairie 
Point presided at the bride's book. 
Mrs. Callie Pressley helped oversee 
the wedding. Mmes. Debbie Sutton 
and Patsy Sutton served at the 
reception. 

Special guests were Mrs. Agnes 
Bruss of Hubertus, Wisconsin and 
Mrs. Maida Huffman of Okolona, 
Mississippi. They are the sisters of 
the late Mrs. Helen Poynor of 
Forestburg. Others from the 
Prairie Point area were the bride's 
grandmother, Mrs. Delia Sutton; 
Bobby and Zachary Pressley; Sue 
and Travis Sutton; Paula Kerr Ott 
and June Kuykendall; Mrs. Lori 
Kuykendall and Kimberly and 
Kevin of Valley View; Mrs. Edwina 
Stewart of Forestburg. 

The bride is employed at 
National Semi-Conductor in 
Arlington. The groom is employed 
at CarQuest Auto Parts and atten-
ds UTA. They will make their 
home in Arlington. 

of Rt. 2, Gainesville, and the 
granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Edward Krahl of Muenster and 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe L. Schmidlkofer 
of Gainesville. Great - grand-
parents are Mrs. Elizabeth Krahl 
of Gainesville, Mrs. Regina 
Flusche of Decatur and Mrs. 
Catherine Schmidlkofer of 
Lindsay. 

VACUUM SALES 
VACUUM REPAIR 

VACUUM PARTS 

- We have it all" 

Rainbow, Oreck, 
Electrolux, 

Kirby, Eureka, 
Panasonic 

Bags and Bells 
Rebuilt Vacuums 

'29.95 8, up 

GAINESVILLE 
SEW-VAC 

Across from the Post Office 

328 East California, Gainesville 

668-9812 

MPS KINDERGARTEN - I to r, front - Travis Sicking, P.J. Richman. Kimberly Klement, 

Jennifer Reid, Krystal Hale; 2nd - Ashley Klement, Nathan Hess, Jason Vogel, Christopher 
Luttmer, Chisam Cain; 3rd - Stephanie Hellman, Laura Drachenberg, Kevin Hermes, Mit-
chell Endres, Daniel Rohmer, Grant Hartman; top - Julia Stormer, Crystal Lutkenhaus, 
Shawn Hess, Adam Bayer, Charles Pace and Steven Boaz. 

New Arrival 



BUDDY RYAN, controversial head coach of the National Football 
League Philadelphia Eagles, was a recent diner at The Center Restaurant 
in Muenster. Coach Ryan is shown here with restaurant owners, Phil En-
dres, at left and Jacob Pagel, at right. Ryan was in Cooke County for the 
recent reunion of the 1960 graduating class of Gainesville High School. 
He also donated a special gift to the Cooke County Heritage Society Auc-
tion - a green satin Philadelphia Eagles jacket. 

Eagles reunion July 5-8 

*STATE TWIN* 
2005 Gelilernle 	Gainesville 	 665 2701 

"TOM RECALL" 
LATE SHOW FRI. & SAT. 910 

NIGHTLY 710 • SUN. ADO 5:30 

"BACK TO THE FUTURE Ill" PG 
LATE SHOW FRI. & SAT. 9:30 

KATHY LUTKENHAUS of Lindsay, at left, is presented a plaque for 
outstanding leadership in Cooke County by Dr. Zerle L. Carpenter 
during a special "4-H Salute to Excellence" awards luncheon June 6 at 
Texas A&M University. 

Leader is recognized 

Special equipment package savings 
and factory rebates for total 

savings up to 

52 . 500 °O 
On S-10 Pickups and S-10 Blazers 

Gregg's Chevrolet 
"Dedicated to Being the Best" 

Gregg Wilde, Owner 	Highway 82, Muenster, (817)759-2261 

Call Toll-Free from Gainesville 736-2209 

We're generating 
more than 
electricity. 

Jobs Power The Future 
Big cities and small towns 
across the area we serve 
are stretching their hori-
zons. They're searching 
out new industries and 
new companies to bring 
new jobs. When the com-
panies see what we have 
here — people who will 
work hard to build a better 
future, some of the most 
attractive electric rates in 
the nation, and an attitude 

set on winning — they 
decide to move here. 

Electricity Powers 
The Jobs 
That's why we need to 
build new generating 
plants and power lines, 
and develop alternate fuel 
sources like nuclear 
power. To make sure we 
can keep expanding op-
portunities for young 
people who want to raise 

families here. To make 

sure you have the electric-
ity you need — today and 
tomorrow. 

Power For Texas 
TLI Electric is committed to 
helping make a better 
future for all of us. And to 
provide all the power that 
is needed to fuel the new 
economy. Electric Power. 
The Power for Texas. 

FITUELECTRIC 
A Commitment To Service 
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Sports 
Koelzer competes in 
Arkansas Decathlon 

Helmuth Koelzer of Muenster Arkansas, where he was a 
qualified for and competed in the sophomore trackster earning let-
Arkansas State Track Decathlon terman status the past season. 
held in Searcy, Ark., May 23-24. Track coack Jeff Farris said he 

Koelzer won his flight of the was pleased with Koelzer's perfor-
high jump with a jump of 5'8", mance and expects him to return 
placing 30th the first day of com-  to the Decathlon over the next two 
petition and finishing 33rd place years. 
overall. 

Koelzer was competing for 	He is the son of Wilfred and 
Subiaco Academy in Subiaco, Pauline Koelzer of Muenster. 

John Hudspeth signs to 
swim for Texas A&M 

it 
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Lindsay 4-H'ers place 
2nd, 3rd at Round-up 

"Operation Game Thief" 
signs are available from TPWD 

AUSTIN - Landowners can ob- ting any TPWD law enforcement 
taro durable "no trespassing" field office or Austin head-
signs and support the Texas Parks quarters., A $10 minimum tax -
and Wildlife Department's Opera- deductible contribution to the 
Lion Game Thief program at the Game Thief fund is asked for each 
same time by ordering official sign. 
signs from the agency. 	 Officials said the signs identify 

The 12- by 18-inch aluminum the landowner as an Operation 
signs can be obtained by contac- Game Thief contributor and also 

fulfill requirements of the state's 
criminal trespass statutes when 
posted on the landowner's 
property. 

Along with the contribution, 
submit name, address, amount of 
contribution and number of signs 
requested. 

To obtain the signs by mail, 
send check or money order 
payable to "Operation Game 
Thief Fund" to the TPWD, 4200 
Smith School Road, Austin, TX 
78744, or for further information 
call (512) 389-4626, or toll-free 
1-800-792-1112, ext. 4626. 

Doty 
Chiropractic 

Clinic 
410 N. Dixon, Gainesville 

(817)665-2261 

Mon. - Fri. 8:30 a.m.-12,2.6 p.m. 
Sat. 9 a.m. -12 noon 

4.13.XE 

The 45th annual "Gathering of 
the Eagles" of the 101st Airborne 
Division Association will be in 
Washington D.C. as part of the 
USA Airborne Fiftieth Anniver-
sary Celebration. Host for the reu-
nion is the National Capitol Area 
Chapter of the 101st Airborne 
Division Association. Glenn Hop-
pert, a District of Columbia Police 
Captian and Viet Nam Veteran of 
the 101st is reunion chairman. 

Reunion headquarters is the 
Hyatt Regency Hotel near Capitol 
Hill and the dates are July 5 
through 8, 1990. More than 25 air-
borne unit associations will hold 
annual reunions or conventions in 
Washington D.C. during the July 
5-8 period to celebrate the fiftieth 
anniversary of the formation of 
the first Airborne unit in the 
United States Armed Forces. 

National headquarters for the 
101st Airborne Division Associa-
tion is 101 East Morris Street, 
Sweetwater, Tennessee 37874, 
phone (615) 337-4103 where 
records for all members are main-
tained and where the Association 
magazine The Screaming Eagle is 
published for distribution to all 
members six times a year. 

For more information about the 
45th Annual Reunion or the 

J.W.'s 
Automatic 

Transmission & 
Brakes 

All of our Transmissions are 
Guaranteed I00.7o 

Transmission Offered for 
'161.00 Installed Free 
Brake Inspection Free 

1611 Tbrockmorton Gainesville 

(817)665-0745 or 665-3376 

Association and the activities it 
sponsors write to 101st Airborne 
Division Association, 101 East 
Morris Street, Sweetwater, TN 
37874 or call (615) 337-4103. 

1st Calvary 
Division set 
for reunion 

Ft. Hood, Texas is the home of 
the famed 1st Cavalry Division, 
but for many of the veterans of 
the First Team, Ft. Benning, 
Georgia is home and they will 
return to Columbus, Georgia for a 
reunion. 

It has been 25 years since the 
sky troopers, with the yellow and 
black horse cavalry patch on their 
shoulder, loaded up at Ft. Benn-
ing and deployed to Vietnam. The 
Follow Me Chapter in Columbus 
is hosting the 43rd annual reunion 
of the 1st Cavlary Division 
Association. 

Reunion planners, both in Col-
umbus and at the national head-
quarters in Copperas Cove, Texas 
expect a record breaking turnout 
of some 1,500 veterans from 
around the country. 

The reunion begins on August 8 
with early registration at the Reu-
nion Headquarters in the Colum-
bus Ironworks Convention 
Center. The Reunion will close on 
August 12 with the traditional 
memorial service. 

For more information con-
tact: 1-800-234-9313. 

COLLEGE STATION - Nearly 
450 4-H Club members from 
around the state were winners at 
the 1990 Texas 4-FI Roundup at 
Texas A&M University June 4-6. 

More than 2,400 young people 
participated in 41 contests at the 
biggest Texas 4-H event held each 
year. 

In contests ranging from 
agronomy and entomology to rifle 
shooting and talent skills, young 
people were judged according to 
their knowledge and skills. Many 
of the contests featured method 
demonstration and illustrated 
talks. 

Two Lindsay 4-H'ers finished in 
the top three in lbw e, ern. 

A 4-H volunteer from Cooke 
County was among 30 honored 
June 6 at the 1990 State 4-H Roun-
dup at Texas A&M University. 

Kathy Lutkenhaus of Lindsay 
received the Texas 4-H Salute to 
Excellence Award provided by the 
Texas 4-H Foundation, the service 
organization of the Texas 

Charlene Lutkenhaus placed se-
cond in Food Nutrition Education 
Event. This contest involves nutri-
tional value, the planning, buying, 
preparation and storage of foods 
or the relation between science 
foods and nutrition. 

Clifford Lutkenhaus finished 
third in the Beef Cattle Junior 
Symposium contest. This involved 
any phase of the beef cattle in-
dustry. Topics were production -
oriented and related to manage-
ment practices such as beef cattle 
nutrition, reproduction, selection 
and health. 

Charlene and Clifford are the 
children of Kathy and Walter 
I iltkenhati, of I indra, 

Agricultural Extension Service 4-H 
Youth Development program. 

For II years, Lutkenhaus has 
provided leadership for 4-H'ers in 
Cooke County, helping young 
people to improve their self-
esteem. Many 4-H'ers in Cooke 
County have received the highest 
recognition for their achievements 
in the district, including Gold Star 
Awards, over the last three years. 

One of Lutkenhaus' accom-
plishments is coaching a first-place 
team of the Share-The-Fun Contest 
at state competition. 

Lutkenhaus 	continues 	to 
provide leadership in the com-
munity that benefits the handicap-
ped, the elderly and others who 
need help. 

by Batley's Presidents Health 
Club. He placed first over all the 
swimmers there on the 5-mile 
swim with a time of 7 minutes 41 
seconds with a field of over 500 
swimmers. 

Football 
camp starts 
Monday 

Coach Bill Jump announced 
Wednesday afternoon that there is 
still space available in his 2nd An-
nual Mad Dog Football Camp 
which begins Monday morning. 

If anyone is still interested in 
signing up contact Coach Jump at 
759-4735. The camp will be held 
June 18-22 from 8 a.m. till noon on 
the Muenster School practice field. 
The program is for boys entering 
grades five through nine. A fee of 
530.00 includes tuition and camp 
T-shirt. 

John Hudspeth, son of the 
Daniel P. Hudspeths of Dallas, 
and grandson of Clara 
Walterscheid of Muenster and the 
Clarence Hudspeths of 
Gainesville, signed a letter of intent 
to swim to Texas A&M University 
in the Fall. He will be studying 
Aerospace Engineering. 

John graduated with honors on 
May 30, 1990 from Skyline High 
School of Dallas. He was given a 
Skyline spirit plaque naming him 
"Raider of the Year." He also 
was nominated for Most Hand-
some and Class Favorite. He was 
named to the All-City Academic -
Athletic Team all four years of 
high school. 

This summer, John is working 
for Northwood Country Club and 
swimming for the City of Plano 
Swim Team. He will go to Irvine, 

"s California for the Junior National 
- Meet in August where he is ex-

pected to be one of the top con-
tenders. 

On June 2, 1990, John par-
ticipated in an Open Water Swim 
at Lake Ray Hubbard, sponsored 



FATHER'S 
DAY 

GIFTS 
• shorts 
• swimwear 
• shoes 
• shirts 
• jeans 
• tanks 
• ties 
• jumpsuits 
• slacks 
• wallets 

FREE 
GIFT WRAP! 

HAMRIC'S 
MEN'Sand BOYS' WEAR 

Muenster 

[(LrLitaal 
It's Not Too 

Late To Plant 
Short Season Milo 

and Hay Seed 

Zimmerer 
Seed Co. 
665-9916 

ESTATE SALE 
New and used towels, 
bedspreads, sheets, 
tablecloths as well 

as household items. 
Fri. & Sat., June 15-16 

8 a.m. -7 p.m. 
3 miles north of Muenster 

on Hwy. FM 373,, 

Schilling Fina 
Oil & Gas 
Diesel, Gasoline 

Oil and Grease 

Propane 

759-2522 

Muenster, TX 76252 

WRANGLER 
Shoes-Boots 

Work Dress; Wester, 

J.R. HOCKER 
Men's &Boys' Store 

207 N. Commerce _ 
Gaine,.illc  

Specializing in 

Satellite & Antenna 
Service & Installation 

Your Complete Satellite Center 
for Coolie County 

Bill's TV 
& Electronics 

2101 E. Hwy. 82. Gainesville 
865.9550 	,_{., 

POLITICAL 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 

General Elections 
November 1990 

U.S. Congress 

17th District 

Charles Stenholm 
Pd. Pol. Adv. by 

Charles Stenholm, P 

Box 1032, Stamford, 

Texas 79553 

(Democrat) 

Commissioner 
Precinct 4 

Ken Swirczynski 
Pd. Pol. Adv. by 
Ken Swirczynski, 
P.O. Box 277, 

Muenster, Texas 76252 
(Republican) 

For Septic Systems 

ROEBIC K-37 
Septic Tank 

Liquefier 

Community Lumber Co. 
01, 112 	Ws.. 	 752 2212 

NOTICE OF POSITION OPENING 

The Community Development Department of the Texoma Council of 
Governments has an opening for the full-time regular position of 
Community Development Planner. 

This position requires a Bachelors Degree in Urban Planning or 
Related Field; or, en Associates Degree with four years experience. 
Experience should include: transportation planning, grantsmenship, 
community development, budgeting, end computer applications. 
Communication skills are essential. Salary commensurate with 
education and experience. 

The Texoma Council of Governments is an equal opportunity employer; 
women and minorities are encouraged to apply. The Texoma COG is 
required to comply with the Drug Free Workplace Act of 1988. 
Texoma COG policy requires pre-employment drug screening for 
successful job candidates. Applications will be accepted until 
5:00 P.M., Friday, June 22, 1990, at the Texoma Council of 
Governments offices. 

Contact Susan Budra, Texoma Council of Governments, 10000 Grayson 
Drive, Denison, Texas 75020, (214) 786-2955. 

NOTICE OF POSITION OPENING 

Texoma Council of Governments is seeking employees for the 
following positions for the JTPA Education Plus Program. 

One manager/coordinator to manage Education Plus Sherman and 
coordinate activities for the Bonham and Gainesville centers. Must 
be available for work July 2, 1990, and will ing to work flexible 
hours including evenings and Saturdays. Four year degree required 
in education, business, management or social sciences. JTPA and 
ABE experience preferred but not required. Must have ability to 
teach adults in math, reading and writing skills. 

One manager/teacher for Bonham Education Plus. 	Must have a 
teaching certificate, excellent math, reading, and writing skills 
and ability to teach adults. Adult education experience helpful 
but not required. Work schedule includes 5 days, 2 evenings per 
week for a total of 35  -  40 full time hours per week. Must be 
available July 2, 1990. 

The Texoma Council of Governments is an Equal Opportunity Employer. 
Women and minorities are encouraged to apply. The Texoma Council 
of Governments is required to comply with the Drug Free Workplace 
Act of 1980. Texoma COG policy requires pre-employment drug 
screening for successful job placement. 

Applications must be submitted to the JTPA Dept. Texoma Council of 
Governments, 10000 Grayson Drive, Denison, Texas, no later then 5 
p.m. on June 18, 1990. For additional information call Janie Bates 
at 214-786-2955. 

FOR RENT 

MOBILE HOME FOR 
RENT: 2 bedroom, fully fur-
nished, a block from school 
on N. Walnut. Phone 759- 
2938, Jerome Pagel. .1.18 - XE 

U-Store & Lock 

Mini Warehouses 

759-4621 
.; Trailer Parts 

and Supplies 
:Structural Steel: 

and Pipe 
:::Complete Line 

of Bolts and 
Miscellaneous 

• Hardware 

METAL 
SALES, 

INC. 

STATE INSPECTED meat 
processing plant. Bring in 

your animal Tuesday. Thur 
sday, Friday. Fischer's Meat 

Market, 759-4211. 10 17.X4 

KNABE'S CABINETS, steel 
siding, vinyl siding, construc-
tion work and estimates. Call 
759-4559. 511.55 

-* Car Wash 
Septic Tank and 

Grease Traps Cleaning 
H & H Vacuum Service 

759.4146 or 658-7268 

CARPENTER WORK 
WANTED 

Also odd jobs 
Reasonable rates 

Ernie Martin, 759.4650 

NOTICE 

55,000 GOLD CARD 

Guaranteed! No credit check . 
No deposit! Cash advances! 
Also easy VISA/MC, no 
deposit! Free call. 1(800)234-
6741, anytime. 6 15•1.E1' 

FOR SALE: Montgomery 
Ward air conditioner, 8500 

BTU, 110-volt with ther-
mostat, 5150; also couch, 
chair and ottoman, 5125. Call 
759-4979 or 759-4994. 15.1•E 

FOR SALE: Cemetery 
monuments, all sixes. 
Reasonably prices. See J.P. 
Flusche or phone 759-2205. 

63AG 

PIANO FOR SALE 
Wanted: Responsible party to 
assume small monthly 
payments on piano. See 
locally. Call credit manager 

800-4474266. 6 8•3•EP 

PAUL J. HESS NO -.1 Kansas 
Alfalfa hay for sale. Any 
amount. 665-7601 or 665-

9228. _.2 XL 

FOR SALE: Glass shower 
doors. tub enclosures, ntirrors 

in all sizes, Installation 
available. Contact Ted Hen-
scheid, 759-4280, Muenster. 

6.I xG 

FOR SALE: coastal hay - 736- 
2248 or 7594590. 	2 22.NIC 

RON HESS REAL ESTATE 
BROKER, land or residential. 
Phone 759-2212 or 759.4864. 

1.10-XE 

North Texas 
Sales Group 
Office 759-2900 

Lindsay-3 bedroom. 
11/2 bath on quiet street , 
fresh paint, 24x48' shop 
on slab, fenced backyard. 
Low 560s. 

3 bedroom, 2 bath frame 
in Muenster, new paint, 
walk-in closets in all bed-
rooms, fenced backyard, 

15x25' shop-garage. 538,5011. 
Handyman special: Two 

frame houses near down-
town Muenster, presently 

used as rent houses. $16,000 
and 522,000. 

5 bedroom, 21/2 bath 
brick, pool, fenced yard, 
all-electric, 140`x160' lot 
in Muenster. 579,000. 

Double-wide manufac-
tured home on concrete, 
30x40' all-metal shop- 
garage, 1/2-acre lot in Myra, 
Era ISD. 536,500. 

Custom-built 4 bedroom, 
3 bath home in Pilot Point, 
all bedrooms with large 
closets, appliances and 
window treatments in- 	u, 
eluded, all in excellent 
condition. Low 590s. Tu: 

Joann Hess 7594782 
Margaret Watson 665-5982 

FOR SALE: 614 acres 4 miles 
south of Muenster on Hwy 
373. Road frontage on east 
and south. Short-term owner 
financing. Call 759-2257. 

4.21-%1: 

FOR SALE 
3 bedroom, 2 bath, 

2-car garage home, 

with cedar-fenced 

backyard with shop 

in back. 

817-759-4864,? 
Ronnie Hess 

Sewing 
Machines 
Vacuums 

Sales & Service 
All akes 

Books & Brass 
andGlIts 	- 

209 W. California 

Gainesville, Texas 	- 
665-2542 665.7445 

Country Tidings tmtunal  
Services held for 

Mrs. Ida Johnson, 105 
Funeral services for Mrs. Ida 

Johnson were held Saturday, June 
2, at 10:30 a.m. at the Lake 
Nebagamon, Wisc. Baptist Chur-
ch. Rev. Carl Johnson officiated. 

Interment was in Lake 
Nebagamon Cemetery under the 
direction of Downs Funeral Home 
with a scripture service at 7:30 p.m. 
with Rev. Paul Curtis officiating. 

Mrs. Ida Johnson, 105, Rt. 1, 
Lake Nebagamon, Wisconsin 
passed away Monday, May 28, 
1990 at the Middle River Health 
Facility. 

She was born Nov. 12, 1884 in 
Barslov, Sweden. She and her 
husband, Rev. John Carl Johnson, 
came to America in 1910. They set-
tled in Michigan where Rev. John-
son ministered in North 
Michigan and Wisconsin. 

Mrs. Johnson was a charter 
member of the Hawthorne Assem-
bly of God Church and was its 
missions secretary and treasurer. 
She was also active in the church's 
women's ministry. She had resided 
in Lake Nebagamon and in 
Hawthorne since 1910. 

She is survived by six daughters, 
Mrs. Helga Johnson of Lake 
Nebagamon, Mrs. Esther Bitner of 
Superior, WI, Mrs. Carl (Edithe) 
Johnson, Ashland, Mrs. Ruth Pen-
ton, Rosston, Texas, Mrs. Donald 
(Elizabeth) Calhoun of Baker-
sfield, CA, and Mrs. Charles 
(Deborah) Eid of San Mateo, CA; 
three sons, Sam and Phillip John-
son, adopted sons, of Arizona, and 
Ivan Johnson of Lake 
Nebagamon, WI; 34 gran-
dchildren; 48 great-grandchildren; 
and 18 great-great-grandchildren. 
She was preceded in death by her 
husband, Rev. John Johnson in 
1939 and three sons, John in 1967 
and Paul and David in infancy, as 
well as five brothers and two 
sisters. 

Pallbearers were grandsons 
Cedric Johnson, John Johnson, 
Ronald Johnson, David Bitner, 
Bruce Johnson and Herb Moss Jr. 
Honorary pallbearers were Cour-
tney Johnson, Wesley Johnson, 
Conrad Johnson and Dean Bitner. 

The funeral service opened with 
an organ prelude by Clarice 
Brygger. Welcome was by pastor, 
Paul Collins, of Lake Nebagamon 
Baptist Church, followed by a 
song, "Great Is Thy Faithfulness" 
by the congregation. Obituary and 
prayer by Rev. Paul Curtis of the 
Hawthorne Assembly of God 
Church followed. 

A solo, "He The Pearly Gates 
Will Open," followed by Rev. Gust 

Hallberg, a scripture reading by 
Rev. Rick Nanez and a solo, "How 
Great Thou Art," by Mary John-
son. Tributes were offered by Rev. 
Peter Calhoun, a grandson; Mr. 
Daniel Avery, a grandson-in-law; a 
solo, "My Tribute," by Shelley 
Johnson; a message, "The Faith-
fulness of God," offered by Rev. 
Carl Johnson; and a solo, 
"Because He Lives," offered by 
Renee Nanez. 

In the service, the ministers 
spoke of the fine lady Mrs. John-
son was and what a grandmother 
had meant to all of them, and that 
she had been a prayer contact for 
many people .  

Vilton "V" Gaston dies at 71 
Funeral services for Vilton "V" 

Gaston were held Tuesday, June 
12, at 10 a.m. in the First Baptist 
Church in Saint Jo. 

Rev. Tim Williams, pastor, of-
ficiated. Interment was in Union 
Cemetery under the direction of 
McCoy Funeral Home of Saint Jo. 

Mr. Gaston passed away Sunday 
in the Muenster Hospital. 

He was born July 12, 1918 in 
Bonita. His parents were Fate 
Thomas and Salley Howard 
Gaston. 

He and Jodell Agee were married 
Jan. 22, 1938 in Montague County. 
Mr. Gaston was a lifetime resident 
of Montague County and was a 
retired mechanic. 

He is survived by his wife, Jodell 
Gaston of Saint Jo, nieces,, 
nephews and friends. He was 
preceded in death by a son, Reggie 
L. Gaston, his parents and two 
brothers. 

Pallbearers were Coy Mosley, 
Earl Garrison, N.M. Flusche, Ar-
nold Dennis, Tommie Sappington 
and Leonard Green. 

Mr. Gaston is a relative of Mrs. 
Mozelle Hutson of the Rosston 
area. 

Margaret Inglish honored 
Mrs. Kay Aldridge, Linea and 

Cyndi of Duncanville met Mr. and 
Mrs. W.B. Inglish in Denton June 
1. They treated Mrs. Margaret 
Inglish to dinner in honor of her 
birthday. 

Jacksons have supper guests 
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Jackson had 

as their guests for supper Thursday 
evening their pastor, Rev. and Mrs. 
Larry Kruger, and Kirk. Rev. 
Kruger and his family will be 
moving to the Valley View United 
Methodist Church after serving 
three years as pastor at the Forest-
burg United Methodist Church. 

Jewel and Carroll Dill had lunch 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Ted 
Jackson. Mrs. Dill had just retur-
ned from Bakersfield, California 

after attending funeral services for 
Wayne Aday. 

Kelley reunion held June 9 
The descendants of the late 

Leonard and Mae Kelley gathered 
at the Forestburg Community Cen-
ter Saturday, June 9, for a family 
reunion. There were lots of visiting 
and picture taking and a delicious 
meal served. 

Mrs. Louise Shults is the only 
surviving child out of the 15 Kelley 
childrert. Seventy-five people at-
tended and all had an enjoyable 
day. 

Poynors reunion held 
Ross and Brenda Sutton had a 

family reunion at their home in 
Arlington on May 20, 1990. There 
were 29 members of the late Helen 
Poynors family present. They were 
from 	Wisconsin, 	Mississippi, 
Prairie 	Point, 	Gainesville, 
Garland, Mesquite, Meridian, 
North Richland Hills and 
Arlington. 

New baby 
Mr. and Mrs. Brian Sutton of 

Arlington are happy to announce 
the arrival of Katrice Marie, 
weighing in at 8 lb. 3 oz. and 
measuring 20'/a inches long, on 
May 23, 1990 at 11:15 p.m. The 
proud grandparents are Ross and 
Brenda Sutton. This is their first 
grandchild. 

Busy, busy, busy 
Brenda Sutton says she's had 

two eye surgeries, one week's 
vacation in Canada, one daughter-
in-law in March, one son-in-law in 
May and a new granddaughter in 
May, a family reunion in May and 
she's ready for a rest. She says she 
needs the next six months to 
recuperate. 

Personal 
Ruth Smith visited her cousin, 

Mrs. Anna Lee Reeves, Tuesday. 
Mrs. Reeves had been in the 
hospital at Decatur and Fort Wor-
th. 

Cliff and Odell Cocanougher of 
Centerville visited Margaret and 
W.B. Inglish Fridayafternoon. 

see  

Mrs. Ruth Christian visited her 
sister, Miss Ermina Dutton, in Fort 
Worth from Saturday to Wed-
nesday. 

Mrs. Bobbie Amis of Plano, 
Mrs. Marcia Carr and Beccy 
Bryant of Houston visited Mrs. 
Louise Shults Sunday afternoon. 

Barbara and Will Payne and 
Tray of Arlington visited Mrs. 
Juanita Greanead, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ran Greanead and Mau during the 
weekend. 
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DUPLEX FOR RENT 
826 N. Main, Muenster 

2 bedroom, 1 bath, central heat and air, 
lawn maintenance provided, close to 

church. Rent negotiable. 

Contact Kim Klement, 
817-627-1101 

Karl Klement Rental Co. 

MISCELLANEOUS 
SERVICES 

TENDER LOSING CARE 

Day Care Center, 759-4964. 
a +AL 

WILL MOW LAWNS, in-
cluding clipping, bagging, 
edging. John Walterscheid, 

759-4732. 6s - 3.E 

FOR HOME DELIVERY OF 
Fort Worth Star-Telegram 

(or any problems), call 
Sandi Rowe Collect 

817-458-4070 

.144.400. *** 0444 10 C• Repairing ell types of • 
farm end construction 

• equipment. 	• 
Spemaiizma in hydraulic, 

• differential. Ira...lona. • 
• englnerepalr . 
• Call Tim Fette 	xa 
• • 759.4939 	.4, 

Contractors & Homeowners 

	Egupment (or Reef 

Red River Rental & Sales !. 
and Janitorial Supplies 

2316E H,oY 13) ,moolle-665 -1.696 

ATTENTION! 

GIANT FLEA MARKET 
JUNE 23 and 24 

Tight-Wad Trading Post, 
Hwy. 922 at Prairie Point. 
Spaces 	available. 	Grand 
Opening drawings. 214-291-
0305, evenings. 

Up To A Real Career Challenge? 
JOIN THE "RESCUE 911" TEAM 
The start of a great career could be just 10 weeks away. Train 

at Cooke County College this summer to become a certified 
Emergency Medical Technician (EMT). Intensive 10-week 
training course earns you 10 hours of college credit and qualifies 
you for both Texas Department of Health and National Registry 
certification exams. It's ideal for women wanting to break out of 

the "secretary/typise 'Jut and for single parents, both men and 
women, who need good pay and flexible hours. Training M ap-
proved for veterans. For details, contact Laura Roberts on David 
Post, Cooke County College Department of Paramedicine, at 
817-668-7731. CCC is an Equal Opportunity employer and ser-

vice provider. 6 15.1.E 

FOR SALE 
HOLLYWOOD GARAGE 
Doors; residential and com-
mercial. Muenster Building 

Center. e. 3. 

FOR SALE: 130-roll light 
bulbs, rated to last longer than 
the standard bulb, for home 
or business. Commun., 

Lumber Co.. Muenster, 817 -
759-2248. 11.211 - Xt 

TARPS 	FOR SALE: 
Polycoat sky blue, low co., 
lightweight, 10 cents per 

square foot at Community 
Lumber Co., Muenster, 759- 
2248. 	 6.1.,I. 

FOR SALE: Maternity swim-
suit from Motherhood Shop, 

only worn once, size Medium. 
Bought in Summer '89. Call 
759-4744 after? p.m. NC 

FARM 
EQUIPMENT 

THREE CATTLE HAY 
FEEDERS (square bales): 
heavy pipe. 759-2512. s 2, - 44 

HOME HOSPICE of Cooke 
County has an opening for a 
full-time, special RN to work 
with patients and their 

families in their homes. Must 
be able to work in a team ap-
proach to render medical and 
emotional supportive help to 

both patient and family. 
Competitive 	salary 	and 
fringes. 	Apply at 	1001 
Broadway between 8:00 and 

5:00 Monday through Friday. 

HELP WANTED: Nurse's 
aide. Apply in person at St. 
Richard's Villa, Muenster, 

Tx.  1st .n vL 

■■■■■■■■•■■••■•,..A6/1■■■■■■■46/116/11.■■■•■•■•■■■■W. 

IN STOCK 
Electrical - Plumbing 

Paneling Roofing 
Hardware - Water Pumps 

Heating - Air Conditioning 
We can recommend an installer 

Muenster Building 
Center, Inc. 
Muenster, 7592232 

•■■•■■•••••■••■■■•••,,111,11,11TITIINTTr 

ELECTRONICS TRAINING 
HIGH TECH = HIGH PAY 

Demand is high for qualified electronics technicians, but to cash 
in you must have the right training. Cooke County College of-
fers some of the very best available in its new 
Technology/Design Center. (CAD training, too!) Electronics is 
an especially ideal career for single parents looking for top pay 

and flexible hours. lobs range from service/repair to systems 
design. Financial aid is available, and so is special counseling if 
you'Ve been out of school for some time. Training is also op-
proved for veterans. For details, call James Yerks, Cooke Coun-
ty College, Gainesville. TX, at 817/668-7731. CCC is an Equal 
Opportunity employer and service provider. 615- 1.E 

SALES POSITION OPEN 
Excellent income and 

benefits. Apply in person at 
Nolan Chevrolet-Chrysler, E. 
Hwy. 82, Gainesville. 615.XE 

WANTED: Laundry person. 
Apply in person at St. 
Richard's Villa, Muenster. 

6.8- 7- E 

POSTAL JOBS 
511.41 to 514.90 hr. For exam 
and application information, 
call (219) 769-6649, ext. TX 

291, 8 a.m.-8 p.m. 7 days. 
6 11-4.EP 



The four wheel coach was developed in Germany during the Middle Ages. 

New GMC'S 
Pickups & Trucks 

See us for expert 
Tune-ups and Air Conditioning Service 

HOEDEBECK GMC 
216 N. Main, Muenster, 759.4366 

11111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111 

I NemON 
Insurance C.,.....  

INSURANCE AGENCY 

For all your insurance needs 

Drawer 0, 204 N. Main, Muenster, Texas 

B17-759.4644 

WE KNOW WHERE YOU STAND. 

Super-looking super-comfortable Pecos work boots 
with lightweight oil and slip, sistant Supers°les. 

size selection. 
' i:. a% 0-13 

Super 	 tool 

Wayne's 	 .......... 

0 	E EE 
ma 7.t4 744 

Lost Luggage R A 	'- 	 1104 3 
209 N. Commerce, Gainesville 	li'J 	MAOerv usa  

20°/ooff 
Jeans 	Shirts 

Dad's Day,pe m0,,ayls,  
Hats 

Straw \Zell  

Wrangler 
Brushpopper 

Short Sleeve 

$2688  $1 588  
liw 02 	On the Cit spare saint Jo 001-2412 
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Gregg's Chevrolet 
Your Local Source for 

USED 
CARS 

Many sources of financing available. 
',Most cars have 3 month or 3,000 mile 

warranty available. 
✓ All cars fully inspected for safety and 

reliability. 
v Locally owned and operaked dealership. 

CARS 
'88 Ford Thunderbird 

V-6, automatic, power steering, power brakes, A/C, power seats, 
power windows, power locks, tilt, cruise, AM/FM cassette, velour 

Interior, premium sound. 

'86 Ford Taurus 
V.6, automatic, power steering, power brakes, NC, power seats, 

power windows, power locks, tinted glass, tilt, cruise, velour interior, 
AM/FM cassette. 

'86 Ford Thunderbird 
V-6, automatic, power steering, power brakes, A/C, AM/FM cassette, 

tilt, cruise, tinted glass, 

'86 Olds 88 
V-6, automatic, power steering, power brakes, A/C, power windows, 

power locks, AM/FM cassette, tinted glass, tilt, cruise, wire wheel covers. 

'85 Olds Cutlass Supreme 
V-6, automatic, power steering, power brakes, A/C, AM/FM cassette, 

- tinted glass, tilt, cruise. 

'85 Ford Escort 
4-cylinder, 5.speed, power steering, power brakes, A/C, tinted glass, 

AMIFM cassette, tilt, cruise, rear window defogger. 

'85 Monte Carlo 
V-6, automatic, power steering, power brakes, A/C, AM/FM cassette. 

tilt, cruise, velour interior. 

TRUCKS 
'90 Dodge Caravan SE Van 

V-6, automatic, powerateering, power brakes, NC, AMIFM cassette, 
tinted glass, velour, tilt, cruise, Intermittent wipers, loaded! 

'88 Chevrolet Suburban 
V-8, automatic, power steering, power brakes, tilt, cruise, velour, 

front and rear A/C, power windows, power locks, dark tinted glass, 
must see! 

'88 Ford Ext. Cab 
V.8, automatic, power steering, power brakes, power windows, power 

locks, AM/FM cassette, tilt, cruise, tinted glass, styled wheels, 

'87 Chevrolet Suburban 
V-8, automatic, power steering, power brakes. front and rear A/C, power 

windows, power locks, tinted glass, cruise, tilt, velour Interior. 

'86 GMC 3/4-Ton 4x4 
V-8, automatic, power steering, power brakes, A/C, AM/FM, greet 

farm and ranch truck! 

'86 Ford XL 
V-8, automatic, power steering, power brakes, A/C, AM/FM cassette, 

tinted glass, styled wheels. 

'86 Ford 4x4 
V-8, automatic, power steering, power brakes, A/C, tinted glass 

tilt, au Ise. 

'77 Dodge Pickup 
V-8, automatic, power steering, power brakes, AlC, tinted glass. 

'74 Chevrolet Custom Pickup 
0-8, power steering, power brakes, NC, AM radio, tinted glass, 

velour Interior 

Several More To Choose From! 

Gregg's 
Chevrolet 

"Think of us FIRST for Used Cars!" 
Gregg Wilde. Owner Highway 82, Muenster,(817)7592261 

Cgil Toil.Free from Gainesville 7362209 
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I-Farm & Ranch 

CATTLE TAKE ADVANTAGE of a rural stock pond to cool down as 
summer heat hits the area. 	 Janie Hartman Photo 

Fungus slices into 
watermelon yields 

mat 
:eat. 
on, 
ink 
,pat 
tam 
as if 
rip 

1.44 

What it is ... what it does 
Every year countless numbers 

of people are victims of poison 
ivy. In almost every instance, the 
suffering could have been avoided 
if the person could have identified 
on sight the itchy plant. 

Poison ivy may take the form of 
either a vine or shrub, with the 
leaf arrangement, always in three, 
the same. Poison ivy is 
distinguished by its three leaflets 
to each main leaf. Two of these 
are at right angles to the center 
leaflet. The leaves may be light to 
medium dark 'green, turning red, 
yellow or orange in the autumn. 

The plant also grows waxy 
white berries preceeded by 
greenish-white tiny flowers. 
Leaves, berries, stems and even 
the roots of poison ivy are coated 
with an irritant, non-volatile oil. 

Occasionally, there are some 
people who are not allergic to the 
poison of this plant, but most are 
not so fortunate. The itchy welts, 
blisters and general aggravation 
resulting from the ivy are usually 
difficult to cure. It is much easier 
to prevent than to cure, therefore, 
everyone should learn to recognize 
and avoid poison ivy. 

This Public Enemy Number 
One of the plant world can be ob- 

... how to recognize it 

tained by brushing against plants, 
handling tools or animals that 
have been in contact with the 
plants, or by permitting smoke 
from burning plants to touch the 
skin. When flowering, the poison 
ivy may even be blown on by -
passers. 

When exposed to the oils of this 
plant, the worst effects of the 
poisoning can be prevented by im-
mediately washing with soap and 
water. Consult a doctor if serious 
symptoms develop. 

The best protection against this 
nuisance is the ability to identify 
it. 

Annual A&M Beef Cattle 
Short Course is August 14-15 

Texas beef cattle producers and 
industry leaders will want to mark 
their calendars for August 14-15 
and travel to Texas A&m Univer-
sity for the upcoming 36th Annual 
Beef Cattle Short Course. 

This year's short course will be 
held in the Kiebert Center with live 
animal demonstrations being con-
ducted in the Louis Pearce 
Pavilion on the Texas A&M 
campus. 

The program traditionally has 
started on a Monday, but it has 
been changed to begin on Tuesday 
this year. This change will allow 
people to travel to the campus on 
Monday, August 13, rather than 
over the weekend, register for the 
conference and visit with faculty 
and industry leaders during an 
open house and media day activity 
before the program. Dr. Larry 
Boleman is the short course coor-
dinator and a beef cattle specialist 
with the Texas Agricultural Exten-
sion Service. 

Highlights of the short course 
program will include discussions 
on: 

-Expected Progeny Differences, 
or EPDs, including basic 
knowledge, predictability of next 
year's calf crop, Use of the method 
to improve the herd, and a pro-
ducer panel discussion on use of 
the method for genetic advance-
ment in their herds. Research in 
gene markers for value -based 
marketing will be discussed by 
animal scientists. 

-A cow-calf nutrition program 
will start with the basics and cover 
major mineral programs, micro -
mineral programs and diagnostic 
techniques for identifying pro-
blem areas. An in-depth discus-
sion of recent Texas cattle mineral 
problems with copper will be 
included. 

- A total management session 
will use a multi-disciplinary ap-
proach of plant-animal relation-
ships, pasture-forage-hay pro-
grams, calving season, heifer 
development, managing the heifer 
before calving and other manage-
ment practices. 

-One afternoon will be allocated 
to a live animal session at the 
Louis Pearce Pavilion. Topics to 
be covered will include ultrasound 
for evaluation of carcass traits and 
reproduction 	characteristics, 
animal identification 	ranging 

COLLEGE STATION - The 
United States could easily double 
its exports of beef and cattle to 
Japan during the coming decade if 
ample quantities of desired meat 
are available at affordable prices. 

A 20-member panel of Japanese 
beef and other food company 
representatives meeting at Texas 
A&M University said the Japanese 
consumer would like to have a 
safe beef product that is high in 
marbling, or flecks of fat, with 
consistent good taste and quality. 

The visiting panelists, here for a 
National Conference on Interna-
tional Cattle and Beef Marketing, 
said the Japanese like American 
beef but have a problem getting 
the product for "a price that our 
consumers can afford." 

"Price of meat to our con-
sumers is a problem that our 
government needs to work on, 
however," Itsuro Shiromaru, 
Tokyo representative, said. 

He said the Japanese govern-
ment first will need to sell its large 
supplies of frozen beef now held 
in storage. 

This (frozen beef) was pur-
chased to fill requirements of the 
present trade agreements," 
Shiromaru said. 

When frozen beef supplies are 
diminished, Japan's Livestock In-
dustry Promotion Corp., a 
governmental price regulating 
group, will need to determine new 
prices that reflect the liberalized 
trade agreements and are more in 
line with consumers incomes, 
Shiromaru said. 

The panel reminded par-
ticipants that the Japanese diet  

from tattoos to computer micro 
chip implants, DNA fingerpain-
ting, health and vaccination 
techniques and live animal visual 
selection application. 

Another feature will be a trade 
show that includes from 30 to 50 
beef industry commercial 
representatives who will exhibit 
products and be on hand for 
discussions during program 
breaks. 

In addition, educational booths 
and research information will be 
displayed by Texas A&M depart-
ments, educators and researchers. 
Participants will have an oppor-
tunity to visit with scientists of the 
Texas Agricultural Experiment 
Station on various areas of 
research and education. 

A registration fee of $40 will be 
charged for producers and $20 for 
spouses. 

Call Boleman or Ann Moody 
for more information at (409) 
845-2051 or write to him for 
registration at: TAMU Beef Cattle 
Short Course, 114 Kleberg Center, 
College Station, TX 77843-2471. 

Farm Pond Management Seminar 
Farm ponds add versatility to 

the enjoyment of any place. Their 
many uses including recreation, 
food production, erosion manage-
ment, and water storage makes 
them one of the most important 
permanent improvements anyone 
can add. 

They are not without problems, 
however. Proper management 
techniques are needed to keep 
them productive. Some of the 
more frequent problems 
associated with pond management 
include weeds and algae, oxygen 
depletion, fish stocking and un-
wanted fish species. 

Joe Lock, Extension Fisheries 
Specialist from Overton, will pre-
sent a Farm Pond Management 
Seminar on Wednesday, June 20, 
at North Lake. This seminar is 
open to all interested pond owners 
and managers. Fish surveys will be 
taken, aquatic plants identified 
and control measures discussed, 
and stocking rates and species ex-
plained. The seminar will begin at 
5:30 on Wednesday, June 20. 

Additional directions to North 
Lake can be obtained from any of 
the club members or by calling the 
County Extension Office 
668-5412. 

culture is rooted historically in 
fish-eating, explaining that it was 
not until after the mid-1940s that 
beef was introduced as a dietary 
staple. 

As the change to Western 
culture intensifies, they said, 
Japanese housewives are trying to 
learn more ways to cook beef and 
to use microwave ovens for cook-
ing rather than just heating. 

Officials of the U.S. Meat Ex-
port Federation, a sponsor of the 
conference with Texas A&M, are 
sending beef recipes to the various 
countries as part of their export 
merchandising efforts. 

DID YOU VOW 
If "Old McDonald had a farm to-

day, it would be one of 2.3 million 
farms in the United States. Did you 
also know that: 

• Farmland covers about half 
the area of the United States—over 
a billion acres. 

• The United States has about 
470 million acres of cropland, more 
than any other country except Rus-
sia. 

Each year, the world population 
increases 'by 90 million. At that 
rate, just ten years from today in 
the year 2000, another billion people 
will need to be fed. 

• 

One way our nation's farmers 
can continue to produce the in-
creasing amounts of food demanded 
by a growing world population, and 
do it safely and efficiently, is to use 
modern production-oriented agri-
culture. 

COLLEGE STATION  -  Long 
before picnicking people bite into 
the sweet, juicy flesh of a cool 
watermelon, a soil-borne fungus 
tries to take its slice out of 
production. 

Mixed invisibly in the soil, the 
parasitic fungus enters through 
the roots, plugging the 
watermelon's vascular system 
"like a kink in a water hose," ac-
cording to Dr. Ray Martyn, a 
plant pathologist at the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Station. 

The wilted leaves stop produc-
ing the sugar needed for tasty 
fruit, and with no leaves covering 
them, the melons may crack on 
the vine under intense summer 
heat. The plant, which can not 
recover from the fungal disease, 
either doesn't produce or yields 
poor-quality watermelons. 

But Martyn is getting to the 
meat of the problem. A mixture of 
the sun, wild watermelons and a 
promising "vaccination" may 
control the fruit-loving fungus, he 
said. 

Texas and Florida, which 
together produce 50 percent of the 
nation's crop, run a close race for 
top watermelon producer each 
year. In Texas, the annual 
60,000-acre melon crop is valued 
at more than $30 million. Because  

there has been no control for the 
fungus - a new race of fusarium 
oxysporium niveum - losses to the 
wilt disease can have a significant 
economic impact on the industry, 
Martyn noted. 

"With poor quality, the farmer 
gets a poor price," Martyn said, 
"so economically the plant might 
as well be dead." 

To address the immediate need 
to control fusarium, Marlyn is 
adapting a soil solarization techni-
que developed by Israeli colleague 
David Netzer. 

"We put out a clear plastic over 
the row in the summer months and 
allow the sun to heat the soil up," 
Martyn explained. "The soil gets 
very hot and in doing so kills the 
fungus. It's like making a 
greenhouse over the soil." 

Solarization under the 4-foot 
strips of plastic can heat the soil to 
140 degrees F, killing the 
watermelon fungus. The strips, 
which remain on the fields 
through the winter, are rotated 
across the field over the years bet-
ween rows or watermelon plants. 

But solarization doesn't work in 
the northern production areas of 
the state because the season of 
temperatures hot enough to heat 
the soil sufficiently is shorter. 

County Agent's Report 
bu Craig Rosenbaum 

Poison Ivy 

Potential is strong for 
expanding meat exports 



FRESH 

GROUND ROUND 	L. $ 1 99  
MUENSTERICOLBY MARKET CUT( 

WISCONSIN CHEESE u, $2 59  
ASSORTED OSCAR MAYER 

LUNCHABLES 	4500   1 3 9  

'11111mIiiIAFIAMBURGERS CT $ 2 3 9  

JIMMYDEAN IB URGERS 

	6 CT $ 2 49  

SHURFRESH ORIGINAL1HOT WHOLE HOG 

SAUSAGE 	1 11. '1" 
Family Tray Pack 

Fryer Leg Quarters 
lb. 49 

Bryan Juicy 

Jumbo 	
I  $ 1 99  Franks 	 Pk& 

Shurfresh Assorted 
Wafer Sliced 

Z5 ' .  3/$1 Meats 	 pkg. 

Assorted 
For Boys/Girls 

Luvs Diapers 

28„60  $ 869 
ea. 

Limit 2 Please 

Pork 'n Beans/Reg. Beans 
or W/Jalapeno Beans 

Ranch Style Beans 
5/$2 15 oz. 

cans 

ADVERTISED 
T.V. SPECIALS 

Totino's Assorted 

POP SECRET 	910.502 8 1 99  

1 DORITOS 	70Z $ 39  
BREAST 0 CHICKEN OILIWATER 

CHUNK LIGHT TUNA .59' 
OZARKA DISTILLEDIDAINKING 

WATER 	 GAL. 75c 

BETTY CASCARA ASSORTED 

ALL VARIETIES 

SMACK RAMEN ALL VARIETIES 

NOODLES 	3 02 6 FOR $ 1 
VEGETABLEFVEGETARIAN VEGETABLE CAMPBELL'S 

SOUP 	tom oz. 2 FOR 89' 

ALL VARIETIES 

RICE A R 0 N I 
DINNER MACARONI& 

Fresh 
Mangoes 	 

Fresh 
Carrots 	 

ea. 2/ $ 1 

2 ni 49 

Purchase limit 
not required for 
Senior Citizens 

9.61 .0.6 ,;2  

pkg. 
Limit 6 w/•I 0 or more additional food purchase please 

Carton 
Tomatoes 	 

Yellow 
Onions 

79C 
lbs. 4/ $ 1 

IDIgANNEY POPS 	10PK $ 1 99 
 

FISHER BOY 

FISH STICKS 

3,1

82"  
86111ilUiT ASSORTE D 
CREAM PIES PI 	 99' 
SHURFINE DEEP DISH 

PIE SHELLS 	8 " 2 8 IN 1   

1 FRE RAP W1PURCHASE OF 3 

DIAL SOAP   4 BAR $ 2 99  

BUCK PEPPER 	2 al 79' 
CONTADINA ROUNDS 

TOMATOES 	IR.Soz 69' 
REG &MTH SNAPS SHURFINE 

BLACKEYE PEAS 15002 FOR 7 9 
SHURFINE 

	PURE TEA 3oz $2 19  

28 OZ — FOR $ 

IODIZED 
	SALT 	1 

HONEY NUT 

CHEERIOS 	27 132 
$515 

LUCKY CHARMS 	2002 $ 4 25  
CINNAMON 

	CRUNCH 	,9.302 3 8 9  

   

1 5 02 $1 99  
$1 59  GO CT 

BAN 

  

   

KIN WIDE CORAO 

BANDAGES 

 

   

flirat Marko 
304 N Main, Muenster, 1-800-535-7248 oa 759.4211 AFFILIATED 

I=E=1 Prices Effective June 18 thru 23 

Since 
1927 

PAGE 10-JUNE 15.1990 THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 

FISCHER'S 

Round Steak 

Kraft 
Assorted 

Barbecue Sauce 

89' 
18 oz 

btl . 

FISCHER'S 

	STEAK 

RUMP RO AST 	LB $ 2 ° 9  
FIS'HER'S 

	ROAST 	LE $ 1 59  

'gi ll/EN ROAST 	LB $ 1 7 9  

Rai ROAST 	LB  $1 99 
FISCHER'S 

UNSMOKED SAUSAGE L. $ 2 °9  
FISCHER'S REGULAR OR HOT GERMAN 

SACK SAUSAGE 	Le. $ 1 99  
FIS'HE'S 

	PORK RIBS 	 
FIS'HER '

S s LARGE PORK RIBS 	 

$ 5 99 
	LB.wP 

LB $ 59 

LB. $ 1 9  

Party Pizza 

 

RAFT ASSORTED MED 

JUICE 	 32 00 $ " 

ADVERTISED 
T.V. SPECIALS 

 

SHURFRESH 

MARGARINE 	,LB 39' 
KRAFT AMERICAN 

CHEESE SINGLES 	1602 8 2 99  

  

Powdered Orig./Unscented/With Bleach 
40c Off Label 

Tide Detergent 
0 

AFFILIATED 
F000 STORES 

ALL ITEMS NOT AVAILABLE AT ALL AFFILIATED STORES 

QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED 

r„, 4,,,,,,,, 
Assorted 

Canned 
Pastas 
14.8 15 oz. 

48c 

APP. 
Cinnamon 

Chenios or 
Wheaties 

14 18 oz. 

$269  

Assorted 

Kool- 
Aid 

makes 2 tits. 

6/$1 

General Mills 

Oatmeal 
Crisp 
18.5 oz. 

$269  

Assorted 

Delta 
Towels 

roils 

2/$1 

SO n. Four 
40 ct /amid. Cobs 

Hefty 
Plates 

$1 12. 

Hefty 
20 count 

Cinch 
Trash Bags 

$299  

IS,  Off Lebffi 
Or1g./Lemon 

Purex 
Liquid Bleach 

128 oz. 

99C 

Shurfine Assorted 
12 oz. cans 

Soft 
Drinks 

Lona 24 ctins *a% 

8/$1 

Assorted 
Suave 

Shampoo/ 
Conditioner 

16 oz.  

99c 

JEWEL PRE DREAMED 

SHORTENING 	42 02 $ 1
3s 

39 oz. 
Limit I box 
w/•10 or more additional food purchase please 

SHURFRESH ALL VARIETIES 

YOGURT 	8 022 FOR 89' 
SHURFRESH 

'CHEESE 	8 OZ 79' CREAM 
SHURFRESH 

SOUR CREAM 	16 02 1 1 9  

sil 

40 OFF ROYAL OAK REG MESQUITE 

CHARCOAL    82 79 
 ROYAL 

	FLUID  30 02 	1 _ 5 9  

DEL MONTE WHOLE 

GREEN BEANS 	 

ZEE ASSORTED FAMILY PACK 

NAPKINS 
COTTONELLE ASSORTED 

BATH TISSUE 

1.59' 
4  75 8 0299 ' 

  14 02 46  1 " 

350 CT $ 1 " 

4 ROLL 119  

DR. PEPPER 

6 PACK  $ 1 49  
MILLER, LITE,0 
MILLER DRAFT 

BEER 
24120Z 

$ 1 095  

California 

Santa Rosa Plums 
lb. 79 

  

Jumbo 

California 	
$ 1 49  Apricots 	 lb. 

Sunkist 

Valencia 
Oranges 	 lb. 49' 

   

Heinz 
Keg 0' 

Ketchup 

6$109 
32 oz.  

DOUBLE COUPONS EVERY DAY! 
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