
The North Central Texas College Board of Trustees present the plaque to be mounted at the new campus 
in Bowie. 	 Photo by Dave Fette 

NCTC's new home in Montague County was 
formally opened Friday. 	Photo by Dave Fete 
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Marvin Knight blasts past CCAD performance 
by Janet Felderhoff 

With less than an hour of 
xperience as a member of the 
Tooke County Appraisal 
)istrict Board of Directors, 
4arvin Knight, DVM accused 
he CCAD and its past boards 
f not performing as expected. 
(night, Don Hobbs, and 
Michael McHorse took the 
ath of office at the Jan. 13 
neeting shortly before Knight 
aid out his list of 
hortcomings, expectations, 
and proposed solutions. 

Knight noted that he was 
.lected by Gainesville ISD and 
he City of Gainesville and he 
sad contacted them before 
iroceeding. He distributed a 
ist from each of the two 
,ntities detailing their 
:omplaints about the CCAD. 

Although Knight addressed 
ais remarks to Chief Appraiser 
Doug Smithson, he pointed out 
la what he was saying was 
nothing personal and not 
about anybody on his staff. 

'You have not - when I say 
eou I mean your organization 
- been in compliance for the 
ast three years," Knight 
.barged. "You are putting the 

by Janet Felderhoff 
Joining seasoned Cooke 

Dounty Appraisal District 
CCAD) board members Jane 
2arlton and Leon Klement for 
he 2000 term are Marvin 

Knight, DVM, Don Hobbs, and 
Michael McHorse. Justice of 
he Peace Bill Freeman 

Yor the three newest members 
dr:ministered the oath of office 

at the Jan. 13 meeting. 
Selecting officers for the 

year was the next item of 
ousiness. Members elected 
Jane Carlton to serve another 
term as board chairman. The 
vote was three for and two 
against. Marvin Knight and 
Michael McHorse cast the 
opposing votes. Knight was 
named vice-chair and 
McHorse secretary in 
unanimous votes. 

Don Hawkins and Betty 
Buttolph were appointed to the 
Appraisal Review Board 
(ARB). CCAD board members 
favored appointing someone 
with experience in real estate. 
Knight had suggested Kim 
Marlin, but withdrew his 
name after learning that 
Marlin was ineligible because 
he was already serving on the 
Gainesville City Council. 
Buttolph has served the 
county previously as an ARB 
member. 

Three names were removed 
from the bank signature card  

entities in a very bad 
situation. They are not getting 
answers and to be honest with 
you, it's not that you won't call 
me back, I just don't think you 
have the answers to give me. 
The internal procedures are 
not there. Your answers to the 
taxing entities aren't on time." 

The inadequacy of the 
software being used by CCAD 
was noted by Knight. "I'm a 
small business, but when my 
computers go down, all work 
stops," said Knight. "Every 
time your computers are down 
we're losing. You're double 
dipping. The tax payers are 
paying your company to do a 
job and you're not doing it. 
Therefore every piece of 
property that you do not get 
evaluated or re-evaluated 
costs every taxpayer in this 
county." 

Knight said that the reason 
he put the item on the agenda 
is that he feels that he doesn't 
think the CCAD has a clue as 
to how to get out from under 
the situation. He said the 
county is growing rapidly. He 
said it isn't fair to reevaluate 
one taxpayer's property 

due to changes in employee 
and board membership status. 
Knight and Hobbs will be the 
board members who can co-
sign checks. 

Chief Appraiser Doug 
Smithson reported that he and 
Delbert West had inspected 
the IMAC (formerly AMPI) 
plant in Muenster. They 
toured the plant and noted 
what was in the facility. 

After an executive session, 
the Board unanimously 
authorized Doug Smithson and 
Peter Low, the CCAD's 
attorney, to proceed with 
mediation in attempt to settle 
pending litigation in 
accordance with the terms 
discussed in executive session. 
Part of the executive session 
dealt with a suit board 
member Hobbs has with the 
CCAD. He excused himself 
from that portion of the 
executive session. 

In other business the CCAD 
Board: 

• Discussed attending the 
TAAD conference next month 
in Dallas 

• Discussed need for a new 
computer system. Decided that 
those attending TAAD will 
investigate systems being 
offered and invite potential 
vendors to a future meeting 

• Approved proposed 2000 
holiday schedule.  

without 	re-evaluating 
everybody's. "I know you're 
doing the best you can," 
continued Knight speaking to 
Smithson. "It has nothing to do 
with you. You're not getting 
the job done. I think this 
Board in the past has not done 
the job.... You need to have a 
game plan. I don't think you 
have a game plan. You've been 
putting out fires ever since you 
got here. Granted those fires 
were started before you got 
here, but all you do is put out 
fires! I want somebody and I 
don't want to go back to my 
constituents, and beg for more 
money without a game plan. I 
want somebody credible to 
come in here and help you 
formulate a game plan. I don't 
think anybody on this Board 
knows a game plan. I don't 

by Stephen Bonin 
contributing writer 

On January 14, as a nippy 
wind made the event even 
more chilling-as in thrilling 
than it already was, North 
Central Texas College, in the 
presence of about 250-NCTC 
staff, board of regents, 
foundation board and 
Montague County dignitaries 
and citizens-dedicated its 
second brand new building 
within a week. 

The $2.196 million edifice-
with plenty room for additional 
buildings on ample land-is 
composed of an attractive red 
and brown brick variety with 
white brick lines accenting and  

have the foggiest clue, but I 
want my chief appraiser to 
have a foggier clue." Knight 
then remarked that he had 
two names of people to 
consider to bring in and go 
through the organization, to 
show management what to do, 
where they're falling down on 
the job and where they're 
excelling. 

"I want you to be around 
forever," Knight told 
Smithson. "But we are either 
going to become compliant or I 
want somebody here who will 
make us compliant. I 
guarantee it's going to cost 
some money. This Board is 
going to have to go out to these 
entities and get some serious 
money for a new computer 
system, for software, for 
whatever it takes to become 

an angular front post 
ascending skyward. 
Comprising 16,000-square feet, 
it is situated at the crest of a 
refreshing breathing space at 
the intersection of Mill Street 
and State Highway 287. 

Featuring five regular 
classrooms, three computer 
labs, a science lab and a 
vocational nursing lab, the 
building also contains a 
library, science lab, study 
lounge and bookstore. 

Genesis 
The Bowie campus, 

considerably smaller than the 
$8 million Corinth campus, 
brings its own flair to NCTC's 
stellar 75th year. Speaker  

compliant w e re going to have 
to go out and convince these 
entities to spend the money." 

In concluding Knight 
challenged the other board 
members to keep in touch with 
their entities. 

Board Chair Jane Carlton 
responded, "I think you're 
being a little harsh, but 
everybody's got a right to their 
own opinion. I see marked 
improvement. Doug has not 
had a great deal of time. As 
you pointed out he's putting 
out fires since he's been chief 
appraiser. " 

Leon Klement of Muenster 
differed with Knight on the 
CCAD not having a plan and 
the idea of hiring a consultant. 
"No, Marvin you don't know 
what we've been doing because 
you haven't been on this 

provides advantages via 
options, so every resident in 
this area has the opportunity 
to expand their horizons." 

NCTC President Dr. Ronnie 
Glasscock said the citizens of 
Bowie have shown tremendous 
foresight and wisdom by 
putting higher education at 
the center of their 
comprehensive economic 
development initiative. 

"This is truly what a 
comprehensive community 
college is all about," he said. 
"It is about listening to and 
responding to the needs of 
those we serve throughout our 
three county service area. This 
campus will enable us to take 

Board. You three gentlemen 
(Knight, Hobbs, and McHorse) 
have not been on this Board 
and it's going to take a little 
while to get used to what we 
do and how we do it and what 
needs to be done." 

Klement asked how many of 
the board members had paid 
consultants telling them how 
to run their businesses. He 
said he found the statements 
interesting and amusing. 
Klement said he's served on 
the Muenster ISD board for 20 
years and could recall a 
million dollar mistake made by 
the CCAD when he first began 
serving Muenster ISD. 
Mistakes are still being made 
and will be made, he noted. 

"When I was on the school 
board I laughed at this place 
also," Klement remarked. "It's 
easy to laugh at. It's much 
harder to make it work in this 
community. When you talk 
about unity and the entities, I 
find it very amusing that all of 
a sudden now we don't comply 
with the figures. I'm sure we 
don't with Gainesville. 
Gainesville has not been 
physically done (appraisers 
going from house to house 
doing re-appraisals) in 10 to 
13 years. It has not been 
physically measured. It was 
not until he (Smithson) did it. I 
want to be here when it gets 
done properly. We're working 
on doing it properly. 

°Gainesville was not done. 
Why? Some of these same 
people who are making this 
hue and cry now that we are 
not doing their property down 
here properly were on this 
Board and they never did it. 
The rest of the county - Valley 
View, Era, Lindsay, and up 
until a couple of years ago they 
got behind on Callisburg and 
we took care of that also, and 
Muenster and all of the rest of 
us - we are re-measured and 
re-done every two to three to 

See CCAD, pg 2 

Chamber of Commerce, then-
Mayor of Bowie Bert 
Cunningham said it was 
apparent that participants 
supported the idea of their own 
college campus. 

Next, Cunningham informed 
the Bowie City Council that 
bringing 
a college campus to the area 

must become a priority. He 
appointed Ramsey to head the 
4B Economic Sales Tax 
Corporation Committee. 
Subsequently, a steering 
committee of key community 
residents was formed, 
including: Barbara 
Winingham, James Scruggs, 
Joe Probst, Roy Curry, Clyde 

Three pledge oath of 
office for CCAD Board 

Marriage: Bowie Economic Development and NCTC 

Teachers protest memo 
on test return policy 

by Janie Hartman 
The Muenster ISD Board of 

Trustees, at their regular 
monthly session last Thursday, 
were greeted with "community 
comments" from teacher Rudy 
Koesler. Representing several 
Muenster teachers, Mr. Koesler 
approached the board with 
concerns of a memo the faculty 
received on Jan. 10 from 
principal James Hopper. 

"This piece of paper has 
caused an uproar. Teachers 
take this place to heart. 
Principals and students come 
and go - we stay," Koesler 
commented, wanting to know 
why the teachers weren't 
consulted on the issue. 'We're 
tired of being ignored. You (the 
administration) undermine the 
discipline we have. Parents 
complain, you change the rules. 
The teachers that made this 
place what it is, will be here 
tomorrow!" Questioned on the 
memo was that "All tests are to 
be returned to the students 
after they have been graded. 
This is effective immediately." 

Mr. Hopper noted to the 
teachers that the issue arose 
last year with the question 
revolving around the honesty of 
the students and concern over 
having tests in circulation. Also  

brought into the discussion was 
the idea of the amount of time 
it takes to make out tests, and 
the number of preparations 
some teachers have. 

"While I understand and 
empathize with some of the 
concerns expressed, my 
decision is based on the 
prioritization of student need," 
Hopper noted in the memo. 

Koesler concluded his 
comments that the teachers 
have developed perfect tests 
over the years. Tests aimed 
toward learning, keeping 
interest and that motivate the 
students. "We are proud of 
what we established." 

"I take exception to most of 
what Mr. Koesler said. His 
complaint was about a 
perceived lack of 
communication," said Mr. 
Cooper, noting that Muenster 
ISD has a procedure in place to 
hear teacher complaints and 
concerns (to keep 
communication open). "Mr. 
Koesler didn't use that 
procedure and in not doing so, 
was guilty of the very thing he 
was complaining about." 

Mr. Cooper later commented 
on Koesler's statement about 
teachers making this place 
what it is. "I would whole- 

heartedly agree with the 
importance of having good 
teachers and we do and should 
be thankful. I'm sure Mr. 
Koesler didn't mean to overlook 
the others that contribute to 
making this place what it is -
parents, students, bus drivers, 
cafeteria staff, custodial staff, 
maintenance staff, classroom 
aides, school board, and yes, 
even administrators all play an 
important part in the success 
of any school district." 

Also present at the meeting 
were band director Pat Dietz 
and several band boosters. 
Dietz asked the board to 
consider increasing the band's 
budget for next year, 
comparing that with what 
other schools spend on their 
band programs, Muenster is on 
the bottom of the list, even 
though the budget has grown. 
"We are really far behind...it's 
going to get worse unless the 
budget is increased. If we can't 
increase, I don't know if we can 
continue as we are." 

Dietz noted that students are 
now sharing instruments, 
which prevents at-home 
practice. 'I don't want to turn 
down kids that want to be in 
band." 

See BAND BUDGET, pg 6 

after speaker referred to the 
amazing birth of the Bowie 
campus, igniting sparks of 
excitement and warming the 
spirits of attendees. 

On January 1997, in an 
unprecedented action 
statewide, the citizens of 
Bowie approved a half-cent 
sales tax to finance a 20-year 
bond to cover financing and 
ongoing maintenance for the 

caInTVis ' s is truly the realization 
of a dream," said Lynn 
Ramsey, Chair of Bowie's 413 
Economic Development 
Corporation and of the College 
Campus Steering Committee. 
"I don't believe that Bowie will 
ever be the same. Education 

some major steps forward in 
our ability to provide quality 
programs and services." 

Prior to the completion of 
the new Bowie campus, NCTC 
had, since the 1970s, been 
providing classes in the high 
school, Moreover, the nursing 
program has been using and 
will continue to use the local 
hospital. 

History of Bowie's 
Inclusion of NCTC in 

Economic Development 
In 1994 the Montague 

County Regional Development 
Council received the idea from 
a branch campus of newly 
arrived NCTC President 
Glasscock. During a 1995 town 
meeting hosted by the Bowie 

McMurray and Tim Hall. 
Yet Bowie's efforts to catalyze 

economic development did not 
rest solely with the college 
campus development. After 
Cunningham left office, he 
took over the helm of the 4A 
Bowie Economic Development 
Corporation, which is financed 
by another one-half cent sales 
tax for bringing in industry. 

Ramsey said the process 
started with the theory that a 
maintenance tax could be 
implemented to establish a 
campus. A package of 
demographic information of 
the county was presented by 
NCTC to the Texas Higher 
Education. "However," said 

See NCTC, pg 2 



NCTC 
13010, 1 cAous  

Photo by Dave Fette 

CATHOLIC SCHOOLS 	 WEEK 

The sunny front lobby of the Bowie campus welcomes visitors. 

 Dot 

'dji :red: 
s 83 Year, 

01A:hSVtiiii s  cea:rqT'osu,extaerswarvg: t i.68aLC:'i! 

utna nrsdich igoo oesdhseodechiltral:  jgegi(  'aaitztrogate  

rade at 

: 

em, Sou th  t:tu  

II 

osritd am, 
Mart 

nsacola 1 

:b

men the 

usgabrtekalPset 
t
he ePse; 

aprsaecedra aiming 
7ociation 

cho Landis 

Mir. 

5  tsarrtiveeriepsdDuollti 

 Emma °S 
ednesday 

0 at her 

nC:s
ay, J 

chi ars of  itedstians: 
'day, 

Sacred 

CT( 

Students 
portunity 

000 clam) 
eras Coll 
gi u 

at 
 al straation an   

On Jan. 

r.Cowrinntho, 

 .m. On J 
tudeots on 
ainesville 
om9a.m. I 

 p..m. sOes fr  n Ji, 
 ill be I 

a inesvilli 
Opuses  

nnroljrat 2  tI 

riots con noon aced
NCTC is 

omplemen 
ransfer, to 

PAGE 2 - JANUARY 21, 2000 - THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 

NCTC opens Bowie campus 	 continued from pg. 1 From My Side of the Fence 
Ramsey, since the base of the 
populations was determined to 
be in Bowie, we soon found 
that we were simply not 
getting the support we needed 
from the outlying cities." 

Despite the fact that an 
economic development sales 
tax had three times before been 
declined by Bowie voters, in 
January 1997 success was 
achieved with the help of 
enthusiastic volunteers 
educating the masses-in Wal- 
Mart parking lot, for example. 

All Systems Go 
As The Muenster Enterprise 

went to press, the Bowie 
campus faced record 
enrollment tallies for start of 
classes Tuesday. Moreover, 
waiting lists had been 
established, and some students 
on them would likely find an 
open door as NCTC officials 
worked to meet the need. 

Bowie resident Maurice 
Robeson will direct the Bowie 
campus. A 1979 graduate of 
Texas Woman's University 
with a bachelor of science, she 
received a Master of Science in 
Nursing from T.W.U. in 1985. 
Experienced as a staff nurse 
with several hospitals, she 
joined NCTC in 1993 as 
instructor of nursing, 
becoming program coordinator 
of the Associate Degree 
Nursing shortly thereafter. 

"My administrative 
experiences at NCTC will give 
me skill in integrating new 
programs and academic 
courses that support the 
overall mission and philosophy 
of the college, while my 
background in nursing 
education provides skills to 
enhance the current vocational 
nursing program at Bowie," 
she said. 

Demonstrating NCTC's 
eagerness to serve the 
community, late registration 
was held under Counselor Ann 
Norcross's supervision. She 
said, "I'd like to issue a big 
thank you to the citizens of 
Bowie for giving such a 
wonderful gift to their county, 
their children and generations 
to come. I'm thrilled that the 
citizens of Bowie have made it 
possible for those desiring a 
higher education to have this 
beautiful campus in their own 
backyard. I truly believe 
students will take full 
advantage of the dreams they 
can fulfill by reaching their 
educational aspirations here." 

Ceremony Highlights 
Walking on sparkling floors 

with bold red, black and green 
squares were happy people, 
whose elation was buoyed-in 
part-by the exit from the 
(unusually for this year) cold- 

four years. I assure you, 
Marvin, the rest of the county 
wants Gainesville to be re-
done property. 

"Every two years we re—do 
this Board," Klement said. 
"Every two years we throw the 
baby and the bath water out, 
we come in here and we're 
going to be saved. We don't 
need to be saved. We need 
some honesty and some hard 
work and that's what he's 
(Smithson) finally started. He 
did Callisburg. He did 
Gainesville. It is not his deal 
or this Board's, what's left of 
it, that Gainesville's not been 
re—done in 13 years. That 
doesn't make any less 
important that its done 
properly. Anyone with some 
common sense will know that 
when you walk into a mess, 
you don't instantly have all the 
figures work. 

The computer system 
doesn't work, it's a fact. The 
things no good. It doesn't work. 
We can scream and holler all 
we want to about what we 
expect and what we want , but 
when it doesn't work and that  

winded January morning. At 
the close of their touring, they 
found a glorious reception with 
an ice sculpture of "NCTC" and 
carefully arranged, catered 
foods to dazzle the eye and 
delight the palette 

In one of the brief speeches 
NCTC Board of Regents Chair 
Dr. Milton Dixon had called 
the Bowie-NCTC partnership 
"an exhilarating reality." 
Indeed. As people nibbled and 
visited, laughter resounded, 
and friendship ruled. 

Among the celebrants was 
City Manager James Cantwell, 
who was recognized by Mayor 
Matt Winters as the "driving 
force." 

Cantwell sat with friends 
Chuck Massey and Liz Read-
Massey and Dorothy and Troy 
Thornton, all of Bowie. Amidst 
banter, they voiced hope to 
take an Internet course for 
senior citizens. The one 
scheduled was already full, 
and a waiting list was forming. 

The Read-Masseys, who 
have a farm, had driven to 
Gainesville in the past to take 
classes from instructors T.J. 
Davidson and Doug Robison. 

As part of Ramsey's team 
and as an NCTC Student 
Ambassador, Bowie resident 
and Steve McKenzie mingled 
with friends on both sides. His 
communication skills had 
served effectively in 1996-97 
when he and others on the 
economic development team 
went "people to people" to 
educate citizens about the 

company isn't servicing it. The 
fact of the matter in this 
county, if this Board goes to 
the entities for a great sum of 
money, I know from past 
history, from personal 
experience, that we will be 
called a bunch of incompetent 
fools who don't know how to 
manage money. We will be 
called a bunch of people who 
don't know how to run a 
business." After the fact we'll 
be asked why we don't fix and 
told they'd be glad to give us 
the money, he noted. 

Klement said that none of 
the other entities have come to 
him and reported a problem. 
He said every board member 
represents the entire county. 
He pointed out that it is a two—
way street and that if an 
entity has a problem, its 
representatives need to come 
to the CCAD meetings and 
make the Board aware. He 
invited them to attend the 
meetings on a regular basis. 

In his opinion Klement said 
if the chief appraiser couldn't 
do his job without a consultant 
being hired to tell him how, he  

importance of voting a tax. 
Talking to people in the Wal-
Mart parking lot, for example, 
he informed them of the long-
term benefits their favorable 
choice would enable. "With 
educated students, we can 
attract business," he would tell 
them prior to the successful 
1997 vote. 

The NCTC Student 
Ambassadors hosted guests 
with dignity. McKenzie feels 
proud to be an ambassador, as 
well as a student worker with 
NCTC's computer overseers, In 
November he programmed the 
college computers so they'd be 
ready for Y2K. 

Joyously, McKenzie stated 
one advantage of the new 
campus: worldwide travel 
without leaving Bowie. 
Through NCTC's networking, 
students will be able to learn 
from people and places 
anywhere. 

Faced with an accident that 
took away his right-eye vision 
and caused other damage, he 
could no longer earn a living 
from driving a truck. In his 
40s, he is finally earning a 
college degree. 

Meanwhile, Cantwell, the 
Read-Masseys and Thornton 
were still visiting, and Ann 
James, a vivacious 79-year-old, 
sat nearby talking to her 
friend. Having made a 30-plus-
year career of playing and 
teaching music, she has found 
satisfaction taking courses at 
the Cooke County Campus and 
looks forward to studying more 
locally, 

should be replaced. Klement 
was quick to note that he felt 
Smithson was doing a good job. 
"He's had more demands made 
of him and more things that 
he's gotten done, more slop 
he's had to pick up after the 
people who have here in the 
past that anyone," Klement 
stated. "All we do is appraise 
property and collect taxes and 
it's always this big, big deal. 
It's not a big deal. Let's just do 
it, but as far as a consultant —
it's a waste of money. He 
(Smithson) knows what we 
need to do, let him do it." 

Smithson reported that the 
Board had hired a consultant 
in 1994 to do a review of the 
office. The consultant was 
supposed to supply the CCAD 
with a report which was never 
done. The cost to the CCAD 
was nearly $2500 for a report 
that was never received. 

The state sometimes sends 
someone to assist appraisal 
districts if asked, said 
Smithson. This is at no cost to 
the district. 

McHorse agreed with Knight 

From the "distinguished 
older folks" to the inspiring, 
earnest young folks, the local 
Boy Scout troop, was 
represented outside by four 
boys raising the flags which 
had flown over the U.S. and 
state capitols. One of the boys 
was disabled. Their unified 
respect for the flag and the 
witness of carrying on in the 
face of adversity underscored 
the reason all had gathered: 
our future lies in our youth 
who are our hope. 

NCTC Professor English 
William Franklin then 
addressed another important 
edifying symbol: trees. As a 
group planted a tree to 
symbolize planting the seeds of 
knowledge, Franklin reminded 
the audience that "trees 
symbolize growth, progress 
and renewal. Trees are our 
breathing partners. 

After NCTC Dean of 
Administrative Services Jerry 
Metzler led the Nom Board of 
Regents in unveiling the 
plaque that will hang in the 
entrance of the new building, 
the NCTC Jazz Band, under 
the direction of Dr. Michael 
Thrasher played the alma 
mater, the symbolic kiss to 
close the wedding. Words to 
the song include: For 
knowledge, strength that 
comes with years of learning; 
For wisdom, hope, for lives 
made better still. For fate set 
free, for hearts enriched with 
yearning; For truth, for minds 
and hands empower by skill.... 

continued from pg. 1 

that the district needed 
someone to help them 
prioritize and give them some 
help. 

"I don't have any problem 
with someone helping us out 
with running the office, but 
that's not the way this was 
portrayed," remarked 
Klement. He said it was 
portrayed as they didn't do 
this and this and this and why 
didn't you do this. "I'm still 
wondering why did it come to 
this end," he said. "Why wasn't 
it all done the same. The rest 
of the county wants to know 
why because when this area 
(Gainesville) is not done we 
bear a bigger portion of the 
brunt of this county. My values 
have been sitting at 95 to 100 
percent for years. 
Consequently on a county 
budget I'm paying my 95 to 
100 percent and I want us all 
to be even. I want everybody to 
be even. I want us all to work 
together. I'm tired of this 
regionalism.... We've all got to 
do the same thing." 

A decision was tabled until 
the February meeting. 

Well, as this last year of the 
second millennium progresses, 
we can look back and see a 
great deal of change that we 
have been witness to. 

This last century has been 
one of the greatest, in my 
mind, of any era in history. 

We now live better, and due 
to health care that is now 
available to us, we live years 
longer. 

In the first years of the 
1900s, people lived and worked 
much as they always had, 
although tractors and more 
modern equipment were 
beginning to come into common 
use. 

But most things still were 
done with hard labor. 

By the 30s and 40s many 
changes came about. Electricity 
became available to most who 
wanted it, and many robots 
came into use to make life 
easier for laborers and their 
wives. 

Well you say you cannot 
remember any robots. If you 
think about it and remember 
when a switch was flipped on, 
grain was lifted into bins, bales 
were elevated into barns, irons 
were kept at the proper 
temperature, a little robot on 
the kitchen stove kept the oven 
at an even and correct heat, 
etc. 

In the years following 
W.W.II new things were 
invented at a fast pace. 

With Congressional leaders 
and the President signaling 
their support for targeted tax 
relief recently, Rep. Ralph Hall 
(D-TX) expressed his optimism 
that tax breaks for families and 
small businesses can be 
achieved during the upcoming 
congressional session and that 
a significant reduction of the 
national debt should become a 
reality. 

'We have an opportunity this 
year to pass on some savings to 
the American people by 
reducing their tax burden," 
Hall said. "I'm optimistic that 
among the proposals being 
considered, we'll be able to 
enact tax breaks that target 
married couples, families who 
are saving for their children's 
education and small 
businesses." 

"These are some of the tax 
relief measures that I've 
supported in the past - and I 

The filing period is underway 
for people who want to run for 
the Texas Silver-Haired 
Legislature (TSHL), an all-
senior elected body that 
advocates on behalf of older 
Texans. Filings began Jan. 3 
and will continue through Feb. 
29, with elections set for May 
23, 2000. 

The TSHL is a nonpartisan 
116-member group that 
represents 28 districts in 
Texas. Members hold 
"legislative sessions" every two 
years in Austin to identify the 
issues that are most important 
to older Texans. Then they 
suggest appropriate action that 
the Governor and Texas 
Legislature might take to 
address these issues. 

In recent years, the TSHL 
has claimed a success rate of 
more than 70 percent in 
instigating legislative action on 
the their highest priority 
issues. Members who are 

Cars were equipped wit 
heaters and air conditioner: 
and later homes were buil 
with central heating an 
cooling, fans were in commo 
use, water was pumped wit 
electricity, as was oil, an 
many jobs and chores wer 
made easier by its use! 

We no live better than th 
rich and famous, even king 
and rulers in times before our: 

Before the advent of indoo 
plumbing the big cities had 
stench in the summers, as eac 
house had an outhouse, an 
the streets smelled of hors 
manure. 

In these times our streets ar 
mostly clean, paved and curbe. 
and runoff water is quickl 
carried away by culverts an. 
storm sewers. 

We are now able to arise ii 
the mornings, push a button o 
two and in a few minutes hay 
the house warm or cool as th 
need might be. Our coffee i 
made by another little robo 
that brews it, then keeps it ho 
for an hour or so. Ifyou forget 
it will turn itself off. 

We can step from the utilit, 
room into a car that will star 
at the twist of a key, and the) 
another little robot will open 
the door and close it again afte 
you have exited. When yot 
return, another push of 
button and the door opens ant 
your trip is complete. 

I'd say times are pretty good 
wouldn't you? 

hope that we can go a stet 
further and consider reduction. 
to the capital gains tax and th, 
elimination of the estate tax, 
Hall said. 

"However, we must Warm 
these proposals with tit, 
preservation of Social Securit; 
and Medicare for futur, 
generations - as well as payini 
down the debt," Hall added 
"I'm hopeful that we will hay, 
careful consideration of al 
these measures so that we cat 
make the best use of thr 
projected surplus." 

In the last session Congres 
was able to correct some of th) 
drastic cuts in the Medicare fe 
structure but was unable t 
reach agreement with th 
President on tax relie 
legislation. The second session 
begins on Jan. 24. Tht 
President will present hi: 
proposals during his State o 
the Union address on Jan. 27. 

elected in May will convene the 
Eighth Texas Silver-Hairec 
Legislature this fall. 

Candidates for the TSHL 
must be 60 or older by Jan. 1 
2000. They must also be 
registered voters and live in 
the area in which they are 
seeking office. 

Filing forms may be obtained 
from the Texoma Area Agency 
on Aging, which is affiliated 
with the Texas Department on 
Aging. Completed forms must 
be returned to the Area Agency 
on Aging along with a $5 filing 
fee. 

Polling places will be 
announced by the Area Agency 
on Aging at a future date. For 
filing forms and additional 
information, contact the 
Texoma Area Agency on Aging 
at 3201 Texoma Parkway, 
Suite 220, Sherman, Texas 
75090, 903-813-3581 or 1-800-
677-8264. 

by Ed Cler 

Hall optimistic for 
tax relief in 2000 

Filing period begins for Texas 
Silver-haired Legislature 

CCAD takes it on the chin 

2-WEEK EVENTS CALENDAR 
Sunday, January 13. 2000 

KC Freethrow Contest, 1 P.M., 
MISD gym 

Monday, January 14, 2000 

Sacred Heart Preschool 
parents meeting 7 P.M. 

Thursday, January 27,2000 

Exercise Class, 10:30-11:30, 
S.N.A.P. Center 

Friday, January 28,1000 Tuesday, January 25,1000 

Exercise Class, 10:30-11:30, 
S.NAP. Center 
MMH Board meeting, 
7:30 P.M. 
Marketing meeting, 7 P.M., Farm 
Bureau Building 

Wednesday, January 26, 2000 

Exercise Class, 10:30-11:30, 
S.NAP. Center 
Adult Education Program, 7:30 
8:30 's., SHHS Library/Adult 
Coed Volleyball, 7 P.M.,Old 
Muenster Gym (every Wed thru 
March or April)/CCO Mass, 
6:30 P.M. followed by CCD Classes 

Saturday, January 29, 2000 

Muenster C of C Banquet, 
Happy Hour 630 P.m., Banquet 
7:30 P.m 

Sunday, January 30, 2000 

KC 4-Wheeler Raffle 
Monday, January 31,2000 

Opening Mass, 8 A.M. for 
Catholic Schools Week 

Tuesday, February 7.2000 

Exercise Class, 10.30-11:30, 
S.N.A. P. Center 

Wednesday, February 2, 2000 
Exercise Class, 10:30-11:30, 
S.N.A.P. Center 
Adult Coed Volleyball, 
7 P.M.,Old Muenster Gym 
Rel. Ed Class 7 P.M. 

C of C Board meeting, 5:30 P.M. 

Thursday, Februuy 3, 2000 

Exercise Class, 10:30-11:30, 
S.NAP. Center 
TDH Immunization Clinic, 
9-11 A.M., Cooke County Co-op 
Muenster Museum Open, noon 
to 4 p.m. 

Friday, February 4,2000 

Muenster Museum Open, noon 
to 4 p.m. 

Saturday, February 5, 2000 

spole d  MMH MUENSTER MEMORIAL HOSPITAL 

  

605 N. Maple, P.O. Box 370, 
Muenster, TX 76252 

(940)759-2271 FAX (940)759-5080 



OBITUARIES 

Alice Lorraine Douglas 

Payments as low as 
$205.16 / month !! 
10,000, 8.5% APR 

60 mo., WAC 
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Jan. 29 banquet 
features Mary 
Lynn Seebeck 

tlice Douglas, a long-time 
.ident of University Park, 
ssed away quietly at home 
Jan. 15, 2000 after patiently 
during a long illness. She 
s 83 years old. 
klice was born in Wichita 
Ils, Texas, daughter of John 
and Lillian Hoge Marrs. Her 
her, a graduate of the Law 
hool at the University of 
xas, served as Probate Judge 
Wichita County for 20 years. 
Mice graduated from Texas 
iman's University in 1937 
th qualifications to teach 
ndergarten and Primary 
sses, a career for which her 
iching ability and her love of 
:le children admirably fitted 
r. She took graduate courses 

Southern Methodist 
iiversity, Northwestern 
tiversity, and Oberlin. She 
fight Kindergarten and First 
ade at University Park, at 
nsacola Naval Air Station, 
irida, at Evanston, Illinois, 
St. Mark's School of Texas, 
d in Dallas Independent 
moots. 
l4rs. Douglas was a charter 
,tuber of St. Michael and All 
gels Episcopal Church. She 
s a member of the American 
sociation of University 
men, the Helen Poe Study 
fib, the Craig Class and was 
st President of the Dallas 
akespeare Club, the 
arascope Book Club and the 
ho Luncheon Club. 
Preceding her in death was a 
ter, Dorothy Moore. Alice is 
rvived by her husband, 
thur Douglas, a long-time 

Emma "Sis" Felderhoff died 
ednesday morning, Jan. 19, 
∎00 at her home, following an 
ness of several months. Mass 
Christian Burial will be held 
iday, Jan. 21 at 10:00 a.m. 

Sacred Heart Church, 
liciated by Father Sebastian 

Students have one final 
portunity to enroll in spring 
00 classes at North Central 
!xas College during late 
gistration from Jan. 18 to 
n. 24 at all campuses. 
On Jan. 18, registration may 
conducted at the Gainesville 
Corinth campuses from 9 

m. to noon and 3 p.m. to 6 
m. On Jan. 19 and 20, 
udents may enroll at the 
ainesville or Bowie campuses 
ma 9 a.m. to noon or 3 p.m. to 
p.m. On Jan. 21, registration 
.11 be handled at the 
ainesville and Corinth 
mpuses from 9 am. to 2 p.m. 
a Jan. 24, students may 
.roll at the Gainesville or 
ninth campuses from 9 a.m. 
noon and 3 p.m. to 6 p.m. 
NCTC is offering a full 
mplement of academic 
ansfer, technical programs 

Alice Lorraine Douglas 

member of the Science Faculty 
at St. Mark's School of Texas; 
by her son, Alan Douglas of 
Dallas; her daughter Anne 
Poole of Muenster; by her son-
in-law, Waylen Poole; and 
grandson Scott Poole; also by 
her nephew, Dr. John Moore of 
Redding, California; and by her 
niece, Judy Moore of 
Sacramento, California. She 
will be missed by many devoted 
and loving friends. 

A memorial service will be 
held in the chapel of St. Mark's 
School, 10,600 Preston Road at 
2:00 p.m. Saturday, Jan. 22. 

In lieu of flowers, the family 
requests that remembrances be 
made to Sacred Heart School, 
Cooke County Hospice, or 
American Cancer Society Relay 
for Life. 

Beshoner OSB. Preceding that, 
on Thursday a Rosary Service 
was scheduled at McCoy 
Funeral Chapel at 4:00 p.m. 
and Vigil at 7:00 p.m. The 
obituary and photo will be 
printed in next week's 
Muenster Enterprise. 

and continuing education 
courses in an accommodating 
schedule. 

Students should begin the 
registration process by making 
certain their file in the 
Admissions Office is complete 
and that records are not "on-
hold" for any reason. Students 
should verify that the 
Admissions Office has assigned 
a "major department" and 
supplied a ' degree audit." 
Thereafter, an appointment 
should be made with an 
assigned advisor to obtain 
approval for classes. 

To receive a schedule of 
classes or ask questions 
concerning admission 
requirement, contact the NCTC 
Registrar's Office at 940-668-
7731 or view the entire 
schedule via the NCTC 
Website at www.nctc.cc.tx.us  

Hey, have you seen those new 
Water Source Protection Area 
signs the city just put up? 
What're they for? What do they 
mean? - These or similar 
questions may have been asked 
as some of us drive around the 
city. 

The signs advise people that 
they are within a quarter of a 
mile of a municipal water well 
and that the areas around each 
well require protection from 
contamination. This is a new 
program that the State of 
Texas has implemented and 
the City of Muenster is in the 
forefront of meeting these 
requirements. The purpose of 
the program is to protect the 
city's good quality water. 

The five steps to this 
program include: 1. Appointing 
a manager; 2. Identifying the 
land area to be protected; 3. 
identify potential sources of 
contamination with source 
identification; 4. manage those 
sources of contamination 
through Best Management 
Practices; and 5. plan for the 
future with Contingency 
Planning in case of 
emergencies, such as an oil 
spill in the area by a city well. 
The first four steps have been 
completed. A Contingency Plan 
is being written. 

The Texas Rural Water 
Association, in conjunction 
with city employees, conducted 
an intensive review and survey 
of each municipal water well 
area. This included researching 
what existed in these areas 
previously, whether water/oil 
wells were properly plugged, 
what businesses or industry 
are close to the wells, what 
contaminants might be 
entering the water tables, etc. 
This survey was completed in 
late 1998. It took the state 
about nine months to complete 
evaluating and tabulating the 
information. Upon completion, 
the Texas Rural Water 
Association recognized the City 
of Muenster by awarding it a  

certificate implementing the 
Source Water Protection 
Program and by providing the 
city with the signs recently 
erected. 

Since the City was an early 
participant, it received these 
services at no cost to the city. 
In the future, all public water 
systems may be required to 
complete this program and to 
fund the cost oft  his study. 

The Muenster Water District 
is currently working with the 
Texas Rural Water Association 
so that a similar study and 
gathering of data is completed 
on the lake's property prior to 
completion of the dam. 
Hopefully, this will occur in the 
fall. Volunteers may be needed 
to help complete this study 
since it covers so much area. 
Once again, Muenster Water 
district is at the beginning of 
the program and should receive 
the study at no cost to the 
District. It will be a pilot 
program for surveying lakes, 
which will be mandatory 
within the next few years. 

subm itted by Steve Broyles 

Large item 
trash 
pick-up on 
Thursdays 

IESI, Inc. is the city's solid 
waste collector. The company 
will pick up large items, such 
as furniture, refrigerators, etc., 
on Thursdays each week. Items 
such as refrigerators and 
others which have freon, must 
have the freon removed and a 
certification tag/sticker placed 
on the item indicating the freon 
removal; otherwise, the item 
will not be picked up. 

by Janet Felderhoff 
Mary Lynn Seebeck, author 

of The American Dream 
Women, has agreed to be the 
featured speaker at the 
Muenster Chamber of 
Commerce's annual 
Installation banquet. The 
event is scheduled for 
Saturday Jan. 29. Happy Hour 
is from 6:30 to 7:30 p.m. when 
the banquet begins. 

Seebeck has more than 35 
years of experience in sales 
and marketing. Her book, 
American Dream Women -
Insuring Women's Wealth, and 
her public speaking stress the 
importance of education. She 
emphasizes the need of 
establishing goals and 
learning to incorporate them 
into daily life. 

Seebeck and her son and two 
daughters own and operate 
Seebeck & Associates in Fort 
Worth, an insurance practice. 
Many of her clients are women 
whom she helps to meet the 
challenges of taking control of 
their financial futures. 

Within the insurance 
industry, Mrs. Seebeck is a 
Qualifying and Life member of 
the Million Dollar Round 
Table. Annually, she has 
achieved the National Quality 
Award, the National Sales 
Achievement Award, The 
Texas Leading Round Table, 
the Health Insurance 
Underwriters Award, as well 

A total of $197.2 million in 
monthly sales tax payments 
was sent to 1,105 Texas cities 
and 119 counties, a 20.3 
percent increase compared to 
the $163.8 million paid in 
January 1999. January's sales 
tax rebates include local sales 
tax collected by monthly tax 
filers in November, and 
reported to the Comptroller in 
December. 

Cooke County had 
$111,779.90 returned in sales 
tax rebates. That amount is up 
21.81 percent from January 
1999. 

"This month's sales tax 
rebates are a good start to 
what could be another good 
year for the Texas economy,' 
Comptroller Carole Keeton 
Rylander said. 

Texas cities received $181.4 
million in January sales tax 

Mary Lynn Seebeck 
as numerous awards from the 
companies whose products she 
represents. She was named 
1997 Woman of the Year for 
the Tarrant County Women's 
Life Underwriters 
Confederation and nominated 
for the International Woman 
of the Year. 

Active in community service, 
Mary focuses on active 
participation in the Fort Worth 
Women's Haven that provides 
intervention counseling and 
housing services to Clattered 
women and their children. 

Tickets to the banquet are 
available by contacting the 
Chamber of Commerce at 759-
2227. 

rebates, up 20.5 percent 
compared to January 1999. 
Texas counties received 
January sales tax rebates of 
$15.8 million, up 18.7 percent 
compared to one year ago. 

Locally all sales tax rebates 
increased from January 1999. 
Muenster received $16,539.98, 
an increase of 32.15 percent 
from the amount received a 
year ago. Lindsay's $7,865.31 
rebate showed an 
improvement of 53.97 percent. 
Gainesville's $264,587.05 
rebate came up 11.80 percent 
from January 1999. Oak Ridge 
received $6,188.65, up 18.66 
percent. Valley View had the 
greatest increase percent wise. 
The January 2000 rebate of 
$16,288.62 was up 456.61 
percent from January 1999's 
rebate of $2,926.35. 

Cooke County Commissioner Virgil Hess explains one the County 
Courthouses almost forgotten secrets. He has been working with the 
Cooke County Historic Commission and a committee of residents to 
apply for a grant to restore the courthouse to much of its original 
qualities. Watch next week for a feature revealing restoration plans 
and a few of this historic building's unique features and some 
interesting county history. Photo by Janie Hartman 

Muenster in early stages of 

water protection program 

.mma "Sis" Felderhoff 
Lies Wednesday morning 

■1CTC offers late registration 

Sales tax rebates increase 
for January 2000 
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USED CAR BLOWOUT ! ! 
Over 40 Cars and Trucks to Choose from. Everything must go. Mention This Ad 
and Receive an extra $1000 off and 100 gallons of gas. Offer expires Jan. 29th. 

Don't be afraid about past credit 
problems. Inquire how we can 
help you get the car or truck 
you've been looking for. 

Brown Motor Company, Inc. 
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Frances Bayer, far left, presented the Muenster Historical Commission with two flags from the Muenster 
VFW Auxiliary to be flown in the front of the Seyler Muenster Museum. Historical Commission members 
present included, from left, Celine Dittfurth, Nancy Walter, Louise Fisher, Betty Kralicke, Adeline Sicking, 
Jewel Otto, Juanita Bright, and Bernice Sicking. Photo by Janie Hartman 

Lifestyle 

Baptisms •■•• 

Glasses Exams 
Reg $50 Now $25 

or 2 for $40 

Buy 1 Pair of Glasses & Get 1 FREE 
Buy 1st pair from regular frame 

selection and receive 2nd pair from 
Mainslreet collection absolutely FREE , 

 (MM. 1st pair purchase $125.00. 2nd 
pair will have clear, plastic, single 
vision or FT 28 bilocals lenses) 

DigitalEdge 
,, sed Digital Network • Nationwide Wireless Coverage I 

• Innovative Digital Products 

THE HOLIDAYS ARE OVER AND IT IS TIME TO LOSE THAT 
WEIGHT AND START SAVING TO PAY YOUR INCOME TAX. 
REMEMBER, IF YOU GET A REFUND THIS YEAR YOU CAN 
HAVE IT DEPOSITED DIRECTLY TO YOUR ACCOUNT AND 

NOT HAVE TO WORRY ABOUT LOST OR STOLEN CHECKS. 

FIRST 
NATIONAL 
BANK rm 

of Saint Jo (940) 995-2556 Saint Jo, Tex. 

Muenster Brunch (940) 759-2218 Muenster-, Tex. 

.4,0eree,... 

• Sign up for Digital Edge' wireless service for only $9.95 per month for 
six months 

• Also get unlimited long distance for calls made from the Dallas/Ft. 
Worth area to anywhere in the U.S. 

North Texas Communications 
2200 E. Hwy. 82 Gainesville 

940-665-3347 
600 Minutes 	 700 Minutes 	 900 Minutes 1.150 Minutes 2,400 MinnteS 

,onaewrO 	 SW 444 500 Weekend 	 400 444 
100 55.541ey 	 700 444 	 43 4447 	 6,7 7444 	
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© Southwestern Bell luthorized Wireless Agent 
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Get a Nokia 5120 digital phone for only $49 
and receive a free color faceplate. 

Date: _ 

Locatior  

Phone: 

6  81 

iGAN 

Daily Wear 
Contact Lenses 

$ 3 700 

our 12..0 0 
Clear Contacts ens For .,Q Care 

Otesonten liesuee 

Contact Lenses 
With Eye Exam 

$7500 
Inc.. I pa. d.a. dnansabla 

*naps vai iaro. w  me 

One Complele Pair of Plastic 
Single Vision Glasses 

$4900  
F1 2116kcals WOOD En. 

Wawa holt...wee Cakaonl 
• Earned in0,1•I • 
Promise. sassed 

Iel Oilers may not be combined win any °Ow coupals. 
ff. ,  Of sales Some restrocians apply 

as-it 

"1998 Store 
of the 
Year 940-668-7254 , 	o  

.Poi 	P" 2 FOR 1 SALE 

OPEN SAl URDAY! 
We Welcome Walk-Ins 

Texas State Optical office  Hours  

311 East California Slreel 	41, -p 9-5, 30 
Gainesville, Texas 76240 	-.

,
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John Daniel Rohmer celebrates first Years Ago 
gLYEA RS AGO  

Dec. 23, 1949 
Rainfall in 1949 to date is 

38.88 inches. Muenster 
Hatchery earns designation as 
U.S. Approved Hatchery, and is 
operated by C.F. Gobble. 

30 YEARS AGO  
Dec. 19, 1969 

Blood Bank's first deposit is 
59 units. Newest Eagle Scouts 
of Troop 664 are Robert Knauf 
and Jerry Fleitman. James 
(Jim) Fisher, Muenster native, 
is elected president of the 
Colorado Parks and Recreation 
Society. He is also Director of 
Parks and Recreation for the 
City of Aurora, Colorado. 
Thirteen Speech students of 
Sacred Heart High participate 
in NTSU Sweepstakes Speech 
Tournament, and two reach 
semi-finals. Brother Thomas 
Moster is SHH instructor. 
Alvin Hartman is re-elected 
Fire Chief of Volunteer Fire 
Dept. Dale Felderhoff, a 

; member of the Subia co 
Academy Trojans, is named to 
All-State Class AA team of 
Arkansas. He is a four-year 
letterman. Muenster Jaycees 
send Christmas gifts to 12 
Muenster men serving in 
Vietnam. Fifty-two children 
receive First Holy Communion 
in Sacred Heart Church on 
Sunday, Dec. 14. New Arrivals: 
a daughter for Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Paul Fuhrmann; a son for 
Mr. and Mrs. Landon Bauer; a 
son for Mr. and Mrs. Calvin 
Evans; a son for Mr. and Mrs. 
Werner Becker, Jr. 

John Daniel Rohmer, son of 
Neil and Donna Rohmer of 
Lindsay, celebrated his first 
birthday with a couple of 
parties. 

On Christmas Day, Dec. 25, 
he celebrated in the home of 
his paternal grandparents, 
Alois and Rose Rohmer of 
Muenster. A noon meal was 
served along with chocolate 
cake for dessert. Gifts were 
opened and videos were made. 

Guests included his parents, 
his brother Thomas Rohmer, 
his sister Anna Rose Rohmer, 
grandparents Alois and Rose 
Rohmer, uncles, aunts and 
cousins Glenn, Gerda, and 
Aaron Rohmer, and Joan and 
Brett Fusco. 

John also celebrated with a 
second party on Sunday, Jan. 
2, in the home of his maternal 
grandparents, Rudy and Anna 
Belle Dieter of Lindsay. A 
lunch of fried chicken and all 
the trimmings was served. A 
Sesame Street theme was 
carried out in the decorations 
and cake. Gifts were opened 
and videos were made. 

Guests included his parents, 
brother and sister, 
grandparents Rudy and Anna 

John Daniel Rohmer 

Belle Dieter; uncles, aunts, and 
cousins Pat, Shirley, Sarah, 
and Rachael Dieter; Roger, 
Lisa, Elizabeth, Caroline, and 
Grace Dieter; Ginger, 
Christopher, Katie, and 
Andrew Dieter; Mike, Brandi, 
and Nicholas Dieter; Ronnie 
and Laura Dieter; and Dana 
Young. 

John also celebrated in the 
home of his daycare provider, 
Donna Reed, on the day of his 
actual birthday, Monday, Jan. 
3. The children enjoyed apple 
juice and funfetti cupcakes. 

Thirty-one young people 
from Sacred Heart Parish 
received the Sacrament of 
Confirmation on Sunday, Jan. 
16. Bishop Joseph Delaney 
presided at the Mass. Father 
Thomas Craig concelebrated. 
Those confirmed were: Jackie 
Bartush, Melanie Bartush, 

Bayer, ayer, Diane Becker, 
Diane Britain, Karen Cler, 
Grace Cochran, Lauren 
Dangelmayr, Kourtney 
Dittfurth, Keith Felderhoff, 
Keri Felderhoff, Bobby Fisher, 
Kacie Garcia, Malony Gieb, 
Ami Graham, Chris Grewing, 
Kenneth (brewing, Jeff 
Hartman, Holly Hartman, 
Megan Hennigan, Jessica 
Koesler, Elliot Klement, Eric 
Knabe, Kristie Lutkenhaus, 
Dana Miller, Michael Miller, 
Charlie Moster, Chris Smith, 
Nicholas Taylor, Bronya Vogel, 
and Jonathan Yosten. 

The Mass began with an 
entrance procession including 
the Confirmandi. The 
processional song was "Christ 
Be Our Light." Music ministers 
included Ruth Felderhoff on 

Tanya Knauf on 
Dean's list at 
Southwest Texas 
State University 
Tanya Knauf, a junior at 

Southwest Texas State 
University in San Marcos, has 
been named to the Dean's 
Honor Roll for the fall 
semester. This is the fourth 
straight semester she has been 
named. She is majoring in 
Interior Design/Architecture. 

Knauf is a 1997 graduate of 
Sacred Heart Hogh School and 
the daughter of Bob and 
Michele Knauf. She is 
employed 24 hours per week by 
Liz Claiborne Outlet Stores in 
the San Marcos Outlet Mall. 

Gospel concert 
scheduled 
There will be a gospel 

concert held at the Gainesville 
Civic Center in Gainesville on 
Jan. 29. The concert will start 
at 7:00 p.m. 

Headlining the event will be 
the nationally recognized 
Florida Boys from Pensacola, 
Florida along with The Toney 
Brothers from Allen, Texas. 
The concert is designed to 
bring Gospel Music to the 
North Texas area which has 
been a stronghold for this type 
of music for many years. 

For more information you 
can call toll free 1-888-390-
1452.  

the organ, vocalist Pam Fette 
on guitar, and singers, Emily 
Klement, David Fette, and 
Phillip Flusche. After singing 
of the Gloria, Nicholas Taylor 
gave the First Reading. The 
Responsorial Psalm was sung, 
and Diane Britain gave the 
Second Reading. Father Tom 
read the Gospel. 

This was followed by the 
presentation of the candidates 
by Barbara Fuhrmann Rohmer 
and Father Tom. In his homily 
Bishop Delaney told the 
Confirmandi that they were 
joining their fellow Catholics as 
witnesses for Christ. Bishop 
Delaney then led them in a 
renewal of their baptismal 
promises and extended his 
hands over them and prayed 
that they receive the gifts of 
the Holy Spirit. Afterward each 
candidate was presented by 
their sponsor to the bishop for 
the anointing and sign of 
peace. 

General intercessions were 
read by Grace Cochran. 
Offertory Gifts were presented 
by Bobby Fisher and Holly 
Hartman. The preparation 

Hesse 
Samuel Joseph Hesse, son of 

Neil and Anne Hesse was 
received into the Catholic 
Church in the Sacrament of 
Baptism on Sunday, Dec. 12, 
1999 with Father Tom Craig, 
pastor officiating during the 
8:00 a.m. Mass at Sacred Heart 
Church. 

Baptismal sponsors were an 
uncle and aunt, Jack and 
Jenny White. The infant wore 
the christening gown made by 
the maternal great-
grandmothers Theresea 
Felderhoff and Lettie Frazier, 
and worn before him by his 
mother and his aunts. Special 

Effective parenting is one of 
the most rewarding tasks in 
life - it is...also the most 
challenging. 

To help parents and 
caregivers improve their 
parenting skills, two "Positive 
Parenting" class series will be 
held. the classes provided by 
the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service will be led 
by Evelyn Yeatts, County 
Extension Agent-Family and 
Consumer Sciences. 

An evening class will be held 
in one hour segments for 6 
weeks beginning on Tuesday, 
March 21, from 6 -7 p.m. It will 
continue on Mar. 28, Apr. 4, 
11,18, and 25. The classes will 
be at the ABBA Center, 414 
•  

song was "Send Us You 
Spirit." Communion song 
included "Servant Song" and 
medley of "Lord, You Are Mor 
Precious" and ' I Exalt Thee . 
The commissioning song wa 
"Send Us Out." It was sung a 
the bishop and Confirmanc 
processed out. 

Servers for the Mas 
included Chuck Bartush, Ton 
Koesler, Tony Moster, an 
Adam and Laura Taylor 
Eucharistic ministers include 
Jackie Bartush, Elizabet 
Fette, Ina Fay Fisher, Her 
and Dolores Miller, Regin 
Pels, Tom and Paulett 
Swirczynski, and Loren 
Taylor. 

A reception to honor th 
Confirmandi was held in th 
Community Center cafeteria 
hosted by the Social Activitie 
Committee, which include 
members Lucille Hess, Annett 
Bayer, and Amy Bayer. 

The Confirmation team tha 
helped prepare the youn 
people included Father Tor 
Craig, Barbara Rohmer, Pats 
Bayer, and Stephanie Whaley. 

music was provided for th 
service by the infant' 
Grandmother Ruth Felderhof 
and Aunt Christy Hesse. 

A brunch followed, hosted b 
the godparents. Attending wer 
the parents; the infant' 
brother Matt and siste 
Kaitlin; grandparents Joe an. 
Ruth Felderhoff, and Bernar' 
and Agnes Hesse. Also Ber 
Christy, Joe, Rebekah, Joh 
Paul, and Daniel Hesse; Emil 
Alyssa, and Amy White; Roy 
Ganzon; Janet Hesse; Stephe 
Vogel; Ken Hesse; Monica an 
Kristin LeBrasseur. A speci e 
guest was Uncle David Hessr 
on leave from the Nay , 

 stationed in Japan.  
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I FIRE and STORM INSURANCE 
Contact • 

Muenster Farm Mutual 
Fire Insurance Association 

	

212 N. Walnut 	 Muenster, Texas 	* 

	

Ng.  P.O. Box 612 	 940-759-4770 .11P 

114104040:4/0:4mim4MI......mPlePilio 

Museum sets hours of operation 
The Muenster Museum will is the organ which was used in 

be open Thursdays and Fridays Sacred Heart School in the 
from Noon to 4:00 p.m. Visitors early 1900s. 
are invited to visit the Museum 
during these times. The 	Anyone wishing to place 
Museum will also open for items in the Museum 
tours by appointment. temporarily or permanently 

Among items in the museum will be welcomed. 

31 youth receive Sacrament of Confirmatior 

Positive parenting class 
beginning, March 21 

East Elm Street, Gainesville. 
The curriculum is intend 

especially for the use wit 
parents of preschool an 
elementary school age childrer 
however, the points ar 
important for any age. Th 
lesson topics include: Settin 
Limits, Use of Sequence! 
Communication and Listenin 
Skills, Dealing With Anger an 
other discipline tools for mor 
effective parenting. A shoe 
segment will be included eac 
week on Healthy Eating In 
Children. 

For more information or t 
register call Evelyn Yeatt: 
County Extension Agent 
Family and Consumer Science 
at 940-668-5412. 



Duncan Campbell 

Texas Department of Health 
Bring Shot Record! 

Parent Must 
Be Present!  

4
1N 	Sliding Fee Scale! 

Date 	Thursday, February 3, 2000  
Time 	9 A.M. to 11 A.M.  

Location: Cooke County Electric Co-op  
E. Hwy. 82, Muenster, TX  

Phone: 940-6654397 (TDH)  
Pubic Service Announcement by Memo, Fruerprue 

OFFICE FURNITURE 
ROCK BOTTOM PRICES' 

Making out your Wedding lists? 
COME 

SEE 
ratta'a Mugu & Giite 
1A1-1  AMRIC'S TUXEDO RENTALS 

US 213 N. Main Muenster 940-759-4080 

See the Celebration Wedding line by Tatex of 
Elegant Stationery that fits into anyone's price range. 
Experienced sales people available to serve you.  

"20% OFF 

INVITATIONS" 
WEDDING Crtietett,t..„ 

 ON 

Mathews Photographers 
PACKAGE PRICES 

One Pose Per 	 Large Print 
Prices 

as  losk as 

$79.00 
Includes art Mork 

and mounting 

Package prices only valid on first order. Full payment required 

hen placing order. Call for details: 665-2431 or 1-800-797-2411 

Package 

I (5X7)-518.00 
2 (5X7) 
8 Wallets -  $30.00 
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Amy Sturm recognized at 
San Diego State University 

Parish youth ministry to 
sponsor Valentine Dance 

The fall 1999 semester was a 
ccessful one for Amy Sturm, 
aduate of Muenster High 
hool and daughter of Mike 
id Joni Sturm. In October of 

e  199, Amy was inducted into 
It e Golden Key National Honor 

iciety, which recognized her 
re  being in the top 15% of San 
• iego State University 

at udents. The Golden Key 
a s  ational Honor Society is an 
loll ternationally recognized 

:ademic honor society 
se :dicated to excellence. 
fly minded in 1977 by a group of 
nil ighly motivated 
or , ldergraduate students, 
led olden Key has established 
111 self as a positive force in 
!ris  gher education. Golden Key 
na embers are distinguished 
Its :ross the globe by their 
na :ademic excellence. As a 

'etime member, Amy will be 
ited in the Society's Career 
isistance Reference, a listing 
more than 500 companies 

at seek to recruit and to hire 
Aden Key members. 
In November, the faculty of 
e Department of Exercise 
id Nutritional Sciences 

rat iminated Amy for the 
og alifornia Dietetic 
oil ssociation's Outstanding 
Itti ietetic Student of the Year 
y ward. Amy was honored to be 

e only nutrition student in 
an Diego to be nominated for 
,ch a distinguished award. 
le will find out the final 

he 
he 

let 
le; 
Its 

he 

On Dec 10, 1999 Stephany 
Walker of Fort Worth, wife 
Bobby L. Walker, graduated 

om the University of Texas at 
rlington with a Bachelors of 
cience Nursing degree, Cum 
aude, and has received 
:creditation as Registered 
urse. 
The graduation ceremony 
as held at Texas Hall with 
39 students receiving their 
achelors of Science degrees. 
uring the pinning ceremony, 
eld prior to graduation, 
tephany received 2 awards, 
he Nursing Leadership in 
lanagement Award and the 
ursing of Adults with 
omplex Needs Award. She is 
member of Sigma Theta Tau 
iternational Honor Society (a 
ursing only honor society). 
Stephany is a 1994 graduate 
Lindsay High School. She 

eceived her Associates degree 
'om Tarrant County Junior 
ollege in 1996. She has 
ccepted a position with Harris 
tethodist Hospital in Fort 
forth in the Neo Natal ICU 
ard. 
Stephany is the daughter of 
ill and Mary Pearson of 
indsay, granddaughter of Bill 
nd Nancy Pearson of 
ainesville, and daughter-in-

1W of Bob and Pat Walker of 

results in April. 
In December, Amy was again 

chosen by the faculty to receive 
a one-time scholarship in honor 
of a retiring faculty member. 
Amy was awarded the 
scholarship on the merits of 
academic achievement and 
activity. 

Finally, Amy was recognized 
D on the bean's List of the 

College of Professional Studies 
and Fine Arts for finishing the 
semester with a 3.9 GPA_ Amy 
finished her degree in Foods 
and Nutrition at San Diego 
State University in December, 
and is presently working full 
time at Healthy Dining 
Publications in San Diego. Amy 
is also applying for dietetic 
internship in the San Diego 
area beginning in the fall 
semester. She will walk in the 
formal graduation ceremony of 
San Diego State University in 
May 2000 

Stephany Lynn Walker 

Notice 
Class 

Reunion 
The classes of 1950, Sacred 

Heart High and Muenster High 
will hold a reunion on 
Saturday, Sept. 2, 2000. This is 
just a notice to mark your 
calendars for this date. A letter 
with all the information will 
follow at a later date. If 
information is needed, call 
Regina, 940.759-2851. 

Health Notes 
Are you at risk of hepatitis C? 
The illness can lurk in the body for decades with no 

symptoms. In fact, up to 70% of people with the disease 
don't even know they have it. In Texas, more than 300,000 
people are infected. It's hepatitis C, and it's at epidemic 
proportions. That's why its so important to get all the facts 
on the disease and get tested. 

Hepatitis C, like all forms of hepatitis, affects the liver. 
About 15% of those with the virus eventually get well. The 
other 85% develop a chronic infection that may or may not 
have symptoms. Many people make the mistake of 
believing that if they have no symptoms, they don't have 
the illness or the illness is mild, but that's not true, said 
Dr. Diane Simpson, a physician with the Texas 
Department of Health. 

You are at highest risk for hepatitis C if you are or have 
ever used illegal intravenous drugs or cocaine. "People who 
have ever injected drugs, even many years ago, even if it 
was only once, must be tested,” Dr. Simpson said. It only 
takes one exposure to a contaminated needle to infect you 
with the virus. 

If you have multiple sexual partners now or have in the 
past, you are at risk, especially if you didn't use a latex 
condom. Up to 20% of new infections can be attributed to 
high—risk sexual behavior. There appears to be little risk of 
hepatitis C transmission in a monogamous, long—term 
sexual relationship, even if one partner has the virus. 

Another risk factor is receiving a blood transfusion or a 
transplanted organ before 1992. More reliable tests to 
screen out blood and organ donors with hepatitis C have 
been developed since 1992, virtually eliminating any risk of 
contacting the virus from a donor. If you received blood or 
an organ before that time, you need to be tested. Blood 
banks and transfusion services within the next couple of 
years will send out letters informing those who received 
transfusions between 1988 and 1992 that they may have 
received hepatitis C—contaminated blood. Receiving such a 
letter doesn't mean that a person has the virus, but does 
mean that person needs to be tested as soon as possible. 

You may need to be tested if you have received dialysis, 
or if you have received blood clotting factors, which are 
given to people with conditions that inhibit blood clotting. 
Health care workers exposed to blood may be at risk and 
need to be tested. It is possible, but not common, for a 
pregnant woman to pass the virus to her child. 

There's no need to be frightened of people with hepatitis 
C. You only need to protect yourself against the known 
risks for getting the virus. If you are using intravenous 
drugs, stop, If you don't stop, use a sterile, unused needle. 
Remember that Abstinence is the best protection from 
contracting hepatitis C from sex. If you must be sexually 
active with multiple partners, use a condom. 

Putting yourself at risk can have serious consequences. 
Seventy percent of those infected with hepatitis C develop 
chronic liver disease. Many of these people eventually will 
need liver transplants. About 8,000 to 10,000 people die 
from chronic liver disease each year. 

If you are at risk, it's better to find out if you have 
hepatitis C as soon as you can so you can explore treatment 
and illness management options. 

Duncan Campbell named 
to President's List at TAMU 
Duncan Campbell of 

Muenster has been named to 
the President's Honor Roll for 
the 1999 Fall Semester at 
Texas A&M University of 
Commerce. He maintained a 
straight A, 4.0 grade point 
average. During that time he 
was also involved in Intra 
Mural Football at Commerce. 

Prior to the beginning of 
second semester, he 
transferred to Texas A&M 
University at College Station. 

Duncan is majoring in 
Economics/Finance. He is a 
graduate of Sacred Heart High 
School and is the son of Bob 
and Yvonne Ambrose of 
Muenster. At TAMU his 
address is P.O. Box 15276, 
College Station, TX 77840. He 
would enjoy hearing from 
friends. 

The Sacred Heart Parish 
Youth Ministry will host a 
major early springtime social 
event when it holds a St. 
Valentine's Dance for area 
youth, grades 7 to 10 on 
Sunday, Feb. 13, 7:00 p.m. to 
10:00 p.m. at the Knights of 
Columbus Hall on the second 
floor. 

A request was made for those 
attending to bring a non-
perishable food item to donate 
to VISTO, sharing love through 

Kathy Ault of Edmond, 
Oklahoma, daughter of Mark 
and T. Mae Kuta of Gainesville 
and niece of Evie and Arthur 
Felderhoff of Muenster has 
been notified that she will 
compete for the $1 million prize 
in the 50th Pillsbury Bake-Off 
Contest. During the holidays 
she received word that she is 
among the 100 finalists who 
will compete in the bake-off to 
be held in San Francisco. 

Her recipe, Pumpkin, Raisin 
and Ginger Cookies was 

The Area Agency on Aging of 
Texoma and The Alzheimer's 
Association, Greater Dallas 
Chapter are sponsoring a 
"Train the Trainer" Workshop 
for health professionals who 
teach. The workshop, Bring 
Your Own Brain (BYOB); 
Learning to Teach and 
Transform, will be held on 
Tuesday, Feb. 15, from 8 a.m. 
to 4 p.m. at Texoma Council of 
Governments, 3201 Texoma 
Parkway, Sherman. A 
continental breakfast and 
lunch will be provided. 

The workshop will be led by 
Dr. Deborah G. Estes who is an 
internationally known speaker, 
trainer, and learning 
consultant who specializes in 
adult education methods, and 
by Dr. Jan Weaver, Director of 
Services and Education for the 

Mindy Jane 
Hennigan 
named to 
Dean's List 
Mindy Jane Hennigan, 

daughter of Mike and Janie 
Hennigan of Muenster has 
been named to the Dean's List 
at Texas Tech University in 
Lubbock. A senior, she has 
maintained a grade point 
average of 3.5 in a possible 4.0 
ratio. She is majoring in 
Psychology. She is a graduate 
of Muenster High School.  

a gift to the needy of Cooke 
County. 

Prizes will be awarded to the 
"best-dressed" guys and girls, 
so don't miss your chance to 
win!!!! There will be dance 
competitions and prizes in 
abundance!!! Drinks and light 
snacks!! 

It'll be quite an event!! Word 
is getting around, so don't miss 
this Valentine Dance!! 

Questions may be directed to 
Deborah Vinson, 964-2230. 

created expressly for the 
contest. 

Kathy Ault, at 42, is a lawyer 
and mother of three. She says 
she's made big promises to her 
children, ages 5, 7, and 9. Her 
husband, also an attorney, will 
accompany her to San 
Francisco. She's also taking 
along a good-luck charm, a 
flour sack dish towel made by 
her aunt and godmother, Evie 
Felderhoff. 

The Bake-Off contest is held 
every alternate year. 

Alzheimer's Association, 
Greater Dallas Chapter. The 
focus of the workshop will be 
on reviewing the knowledge, 
skills, and attitudes needed by 
learning facilitators in order to 
work successfully with groups 
in staff development/training 
seminars. Applications have 
been submitted for continuing 
education approval for nurses, 
social workers and nursing 
home administrators. 

A registration fee will be 
charged. For additional 
information, please call the 
Alzheimer's Association, 
Greater Dallas Chapter at 1-
800-515-8201 or the Area 
Agency on Aging of Texoma at 
1-800-667-8264; or visit the 
Alzheimer's Association's Web 
site at www.alzdallas.org . 

News of 
the 	Sick 

Jeanette (Haverkamp) 
Wickliffe of Irving is very ill. 
Cards and letters will reach 
her addressed to 3706 
Yellowstone, Irving, TX 75062. 
Former classmates especially 
will want to know. The 
information was sent by her 
sister, Olivia (Haverkamp) 
Forgey of Dallas. They are 
daughters of the late Mary and 
Lee Haverkamp, former 
Muenster residents. 
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Stephany Lynn Walker 
receives BS degree from UTA 

Niece of Evie Felderhoff, 
Kathy Ault, in bake-off finals 

Alzheimer's care training set 
for Feb. 15 at Agency on Aging 

Raffle sponsored by: Angelic Acappella 
Prizes to be given away on Jan. 30, 2000 at our noon fish fry. 

Need not be present to win. 

Tickets: $1 — I ticket, 55 — 6 tickets 
1. Collectable Porcelain Doll made by doll 
destper, Patricia Oursinberry of Missoun - 
donated by Karen Smith 
2. WeddIn5din9 OWN with pillow shams. 

• double bed size - donated by Stacie Miler 
3. Watedord swat Pear Candelleder 
with candle - donated by Brenda Backer 
4. Set of Four Culled Flacemats and 
Napkins - donated by Lane Barlush 

S Handmade Sterling Silver and 
Austrian Crystal Rosary 
- donated by Brenda seeker 
6. Handmade Crystal and Ruby 
Rosary donated by Lanie Barbell 
7 1999 Beanie Baby Holiday 
cooed= - donated by SisteesGift Shop 
FL Ty Beanie Buddy donated by staters 
Gd1sPop 
9. Germania Beanre Baby - donated by 
Waylon & Anne Poole 

We are raising money for our New York City Trip we are taking 
March 16.19. While we are in New York, we will be singing at the Statue 
of Libeny and Saint John's Cathedrals the largest cathedral in the world. 

Contact any Angelic Choir members for tickets. 
Diane Becker 759-2803, Dana Miller 759-4932, 

Melanie Banish 759.4215, Jackie Banish 759-2800 

We Thank You For Your Support 

0 

WALLACE INGLISH, CFP 

117 N. Commerce, Gainesville 
Business 
	

Fax 
(  (940) 665-5863 (940) 665-0723 

I 	F M W „,„„fi„,i, 
bullrallee 

4gell, , 	INSURANCE AGENCY 

For all your insurance needs 

Drawer 0, 204 N. Main, Muenster, TX 

940-759-4644 

Sunday, January 30 
serving 11 a.m. to 1:00 p.m. 

at 

Sacred Heart Community Center Cafeteria 

Benny & Lenny assisted by Mike Stoffels 

are frying fish for 

Sacred Hear' Angelic Acappella Choir's 
New York trip 

Advance ticket sales only 

Suggested Donation • Adult $7.00 • Children $5.00 
o Tickets available from any Angelic Acappella Choir member, 

Muenster Enterprise, Lynda Yosten 759-4596 after 4 p.m. 

& Tina Cox 759-4369 after 5 p.m. 	 0 
Entertainment starting at 12:15 

by Barbershop Chords and Angelic Acappella 

BENEFIT FISH FRY 0 

Sacred Heart 
cek4 



BAND BUDGET 
Pat Fuhrmann, band parent, 

noted that most instruments 
are 20 years and more old and 
beyond feasible repair. "Band 
enriches our children's lives. 
The morale has improved - the 
kids are proud to be in band. 
We have a good band. We want 
to keep it and improve. Studies 
show band and music is a plus 
for students," Fuhrmann 
added. Dietz also noted that 
there could be a dozen senior 
class members in next year's 
band - a first in a long time. 

Other information items 
discussed included attendance 
data from the first semester. 
The average daily attendance 
(ADA) for the school was 476. 
The state, the Texas Education 
Agency, projected an ADA of 
453 students, so the district 
should receive additional 
funds. Muenster ISD had an 
attendance of 98.177 the first 
half of the year. "Our ADA and 
other areas are looking good," 
Cooper concluded. 

Cooper was also questioned 
on the progress of the ramp 
into the football bleachers. It 
was noted that if graduation 
was going to be held in the 
stadium, handicapped people 
would not be able to sit with 
other family members. Cooper 
noted that the project was to be 
done this summer before the 
next football season, but an 
attempt will be made to 
complete the project before 
graduation. 

Action was taken by the 
board for a May 6 Board 
election day. The terms of Tom 
Hartman, Neil Huchton, and 
Jim Endres will be expiring. 
The board also appointed 
Edgar Dyer as election judge 
and Carol Klement to be 
absentee voting clerk. 

Superintendent Steve Cooper 
presented his letter of 
resignation to the board, which 
president Clifford Sicking read 

/e 
S962F•IT 

DIAMOND 
SOLITAIRES 
All in 14 Karat Cold 
Choose from widest 

selection of sizes 
and prices. 

$195 and up 

S WE, 

■ 

Sanders 
Jewelry 
Hest Side of Courthouse 
Donntoson Historical 

Gainesville 

(940) 665-2242 

Bubble baths can cause infection 
Bubbles in the bath water can make bath time fun, but 

parents should be careful. In most cases, a bubble bath is 
fun and harmless. Some girls with sensitive skin may 
develop problems from bubble soap. 

Chemicals in bubble soap, such as those that provide 
color and scent, can irritate sensitive skin and sometimes 
lead to urinary—tract infections, say physicians. If your 
child develops red, irritated skin or experiences burning 
during urination, stop using bubble bath. If the burning or 
irritation continues after you've stopped using the soap, see 
a doctor. 

When choosing bath products for your child, look for 
those that were specifically developed for children's 
sensitive skin, with a minimum of color or scent added. 
Save the bubble bath for a special treat instead of using it 
every night. Also make sure that the water isn't too hot for 
comfortable soaking. Test the water temperature yourself 
before letting your child in the tub. One more thing to look 
out for when using bubble bath: the slippery surface that 
can be caused by the soap. Help your child get in and out of 
the tub, and supervise your child when using bubble bath. 

COOKE 
COUNTY 

ELECTRIC 
COOPERATIVE 

940-759-2211 
"Local People Who Care!" 

  

How To KEEP YOUR KIDS FREE OF DRUGS. 

Rule #1. 
Understand Why. 

- h,m, 	,c1%■ - ays Its rebellion, alienation, despair, 
peer pressure or some combination. As a parent 

you can have a powerful effect on how your kids 
deal with these things. And whether they see 

drugs as an answer. One of the biggest deterrents 

is talking with your kids about drugs. To learn 
more, call for a free parent's handbook. 

Partnership for a Drug-Free Texas and America 
TOLL FREE 

1-877-9-NO DRUG 

Green Tips 
Fact: Insulation reduces the rate of heat flow, lowering 

a/c and heating costs. Adding 1" of insulation to an 
uninsulated wall can reduce heat loss (winter) or heat gain 
(summer) through that wall by 40-507. Tip: Be sure that 
your ceiling is fully insulated. That is where most heat is 
lost. Adding insulation can save 3000Wh/yr, or $250. That 
will also keep 5000 pounds of carbon dioxide from the 
atmosphere. 

BE INSURANCE 
SMART Y 

C 
John S. 
Bartush 

213 N Main. 
Muenster 

940-759-4052 

HELPING YOU 	c 

Does Your Child HATE to read? 
This is frequently a sign of a vision problem. 

20/20 vision doesn't mean a child's eyes are working properly. 

The Vision Development Center at York Eye Aucniates 
Offers special testing to analyze reading skills. 

'Easley 's reading grad, naps. ed from a 	 is an "4 " 	a feu eloaiAr 
auth scam therapy. 

York Eye Associates, P.C. 
Call 940-759 -4700 

For an appointment today 
Located in Muenster nest 

Muenster Mernonal Hospital 

FARM 
BUREAU 
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School News 
MHS students bring home trophies and medals 

Muenster High School 
students competed in an 
academic meet held on Jan. 15 
at Wichita Falls High School. 
They competed in the small 
schools division, which consists 
of high schools in classification 
A, AA, and AAA. Results of the 
students that represented 
Muenster High School are: 

Chris Jackson, 1st Computer 
Science, 6th Number Sense, 1st 
Number Sense team, 2nd 
Computer Science team, and 
3rd Accounting team. 

Doug Knabe, 2nd Computer 
Science, 2nd Number Sense, 
1st Number Sense team, 2nd 
Computer Science team, 4th 

January is School Board 
Recognition Month, with the 
goal of building awareness of 
the vital role an elected board 
of education plays in our 
society. 

The Muenster and Lindsay 
Independent School Districts 
are joining other districts 
throughout the state in 
recognizing the important 
contributions trustees make to 
their schools and communities. 

Texans benefit every day 
from the dedicated energies 
and countless hours devoted by 
a group of more than 7,000 
men and women across the 
state. These public servants 

Mathematics. 
Daniel 	Rohmer, 	3rd 

Computer Applications, 1st 
Computer Applications team. 

Jeff Klement, 3rd Current 
Issues and Events, 1st Current 
Issues and Events team. 

Allison Endres, 1st News 
Writing, 1st Current Issues 
and Events team. 

Kristie Lutkenhaus, 4th 
Current Issues, 1st Current 
Issues team. 

Bronya Vogel, 1st Number 
Sense team, 3rd Accounting 
team. 

Grant Hartman, 2nd 
Computer Science team. 6th 

are elected to serve by local 
citizens and receive no 
compensation for their tireless 
efforts. These men and women 
are the local school board 
members of Texas. 

Members of Muenster's 
School Board are Cliff Sicking, 
Tom Hartman, Peggy 
Lutkenhaus, Neil Huchton, 
Jim Endres, Tim Felderhoff, 
and Nick Walterscheid. 

The men and women serving 
Lindsay ISD are Earl 
Cunningham, Rudy Zimmerer, 
Donna Hess, Michael Kendall, 
David Arendt, Danny 
Nortman, and Pat Zimmerer. 

Mathematics, 4th Computer 
Applications, 1st Computer 
Applications team. 

Chris York, 6th Computer 
Applications, 1st Computer 
Applications team. 

Brett Howell, 3rd Accounting 
team. 

Other students competing 
but not placing were Laura 
Drachenberg in Prose and 
Poetry, Greg Johnson in 
Spelling and Current Issues. 
and Chris McLaughlin in 
Computer Science. 

Paty Lozoya and Jerry 
Eckart traveled with the 
students as sponsors 

WEEK OF JAN. 24-28  
SACRED HEART 
S.NA.P. MENUS 

Mon. - Hot dogs, celery and 
carrot sticks, dip, fruit. 

Tues. - Lasagna casserole, 
mixed vegetables, salad, fruit, 
garlic toast. 

Wed. - Salisbury steaks, 
potatoes, green beans, fruit, 
bread. 

Thurs. - Ham, potato salad, 
baked beans, pineapple, bread. 

Fri. - Hamburgers 
w/trimmings, curly Qs, fruit. 

MUENSTER ISD 
Mon. - Beef enchiladas, chili 

and cheese, lettuce salad 
w/dressing, beans, fruit, 
banana bread. 

Tues. - Steak fingers, 
creamed potatoes w/gravy, 
green beans, fruit, hot rolls. 

Wed. - Ham and cheese 
sandwiches, potato salad, 
lettuce and tomatoes, fruit, 
cookies, carrot sticks. 

Thurs. - Fried chicken, 
creamed potatoes w/gravy, 
corn, fruit, hot rolls. 
Fri. - Barbecue sandwiches, 
French fries, pork and beans, 
pickles and onions, fruit, ice 
cream. 

Oust A Thought) 
A person who makes no 
mistakes does not usually make 
anything. 
Nothing will happen today that 
I can't handle. 

LINDSAY ISD 
Mon. - Spaghetti and meat 

sauce, lettuce salad, corn, 
pineapple, bread. 

Tues. - Chicken sandwich, 
French fries, pinto beans, 
pears. 

Wed. - Tacos, applesauce, 
corn, peaches, bread. 

Thurs. - Hamburger 
w/trimmings, French fries, ice 
cream. 

Fri. - Chili, mashed potatoes, 
crackers, jello, bread. 

ERA ISD 
Mon. - Chicken fried steak or 

chicken nuggets, mashed 
potatoes, gravy, tossed salad, 
fruit cocktail, hot roll. 

Tues. - Crispy tacos, 
shredded cheese, trimmings, 
corn, sunshine bar. 

Wed. - Lasagna or egg roll, 
green beans, sweet potatoes, 
garlic breadsticks, tossed salad. 

Thurs. - Chicken pot pie or 
steak fingers, broccoli and 
cheese, strawberry applesauce, 
tossed salad, Missouri cookie. 

Fri. - Sub sandwich, potato 
chips, trimmings, pickle 
spears, ice cream. 

4E6 
Sacred Heart students are 
bringing history to life in the 
classroom by portraying famous 
i ndividuals. Each historical 
person comes before an 
audience of students 
representing the American Press 
and are asked questions about 
their lives, their decisions, and 
their controversy. At right, Luke 
Endres plays the part of Crazy 
Horse. Above Sayaha Kavatobe 
is Emperor Meip and, at right, 
Mother Cabrini is portrayed by 
Kristin Smith. Interviews will be 
opened to the community on Feb. 
11 with Wyatt Earp and Hillary 
Clinton, and on Feb. 18 with 
Harry Truman and Bonnie Parker. 
Former SH student Jenny Endres 
introduced this unique learning 
technique. 

Photos by Janie Hartman 

- 

cont. from pg. 1 

commented that he didn 
believe the size of the building 
that was bidded out was going 
to serve the district's purpose 
No action was taken. 

Dealing with personnel need 
the board hired JoEII Kenir 
full time. 

Organ &Tissue 
DONATION 

For a free brochure call 

1-800-355-SHARE. 

Join 
the 30 Million 

Americans 
who e-f i I e ! 

Get your refund 	half the usual 

time - even faster vnth Direct 

Deposit - using IRS e-file We'll 

prepare your return and file it 

with the IRS electronically It' fast. 

accurate, and secure with proof of 

acceptance within 48 hours. 

Authorized IRS a-file Provider 

Duane Knabe, C.P.A. 
(940) 759-4010 

124 5 Mesquite 

Muenster. Texas 76252 

"To touch across 
the miles" 

What beuer was to keep in 

touch and say "I Care" to those 

ho arc important to you, than 

with a subscnption tone 

Muenster Enterpnse, All year 

'round. your friends. family and 

business associates will 

appreciate your thoughtfulness 

and this unique and special gift. 

How wonderful it Is to receive 

news of home from someone 

W ho cares. 

\It ENSTER ENTERPRISE 

P.O. BOX 190 

Nit ENSTER, TX 76252 

940-759-4311 

January is school board 
recognition month 

Academic meet participants from Muenster ISD include, from left, instructor Jerry Eckart, Jeff Klement, 
Grant Hartman, Daniel Rohmer, Laura Drachenberg, Allison Endres, Bronya Vogel, Kristi Lutkenhaus, 
Chris McLaughlin, Doug Knabe, Chris Jackson. Greg Johnson. sponsor Paty Lozoya, and Chris York. Not 
pictured is Brett Howell. Photo by Janie Hartman 
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to the members. Cooper's last 
day as Muenster ISE 
superintendent will be May 31 
2000. The new administrator 
can start on June 1. The boar( 
approved his retirement. 

The trustees were to talc( 
action on bids for a meta 
maintenance building, but the 
action was tabled because o 
the lack of definite size am 
location of the building. Three 
bids were submitted, but 
Sicking thought maybe thi 
maintenance building could be 
incorporated with a new fielc 
house. The possibility of a fielc 
house was briefly discussed at 
an earlier board meeting. Th( 
idea of adding to the present 
gym was no good - to, 
expensive. 

	

The 	bus/maintenance 
building is needed to centralize 
tools, parts, and supplies wid -
e work bench area according ti 
Rick Walterscheid 
maintenance director, wh, On Jan 
noted they are presently Nmor 

	

on gravel. Nick Walterschei 	ational 
working on buses and mower hi gh Schc 

,eography 
_ Auden. 

k the t 
gr.idr our 

I .relsnn 



erred Heart Geography Bee winners, from left, Cindy Hartman, Whitecotton, Adam Dangelmayr, Andy Davis, Lauren Sepanski, David 
cah Flusche, Stephen Davis, Kathryn Sepanski, Diana Knabe, Sarah Walterscheid, and Principal Jack Murdock. 

Photo by Janie Hartman 

sacred Heart School holds geography bee 

uenster ISD Geography Bee winners, from left – front: Sean Fuhrmann, Leah Vinson, Anna Jackson, 
letus Fuhrmann, Brad Endres; Back – Honor Society members: Grant Hartman, Pamela Lutkenhaus, 
ally Felderhoff, Allison Endres, Darren Hennigan, and Casey Walterscheid. Photo by Janie Hartman 

VIHS Honor Society sponsors geography bee 

Health & Safety Tips 
Do you have strange cravings? 

If you've installed an automated ice maker to satisfy your 
craving to eat ice, or if you're dining on actual mud pies —
your body may be trying to tell you it needs iron. Neither ice 
nor dirt will add iron to your diet, but there may be a link 
between nonfood cravings and iron deficiency. 

An appetite for nonfood items — such as ice, dirt, clay 
paste, starch, hair and refrigerator frost — is called pica. The 
connection between pica and iron deficiency is unclear, but 
consuming clay actually worsens the deficiency because clay 
inhibits iron absorption. 

Pica is most often reported among pregnant women, but it 
can occur among nonpregnant women, men, and children. 
Children usually outgrow it, but make sure they aren't eating 
toxic items, such as lead–containing paint chips. 

If you find yourself craving lots of nonfood items, see your 
doctor. Usually adding iron to the diet is enough to curb your 
appetite. 

Information supplied by UT Southwestern Medical Center at Dallas 

Caregivers provide valuable 
support to families and friends 

More and more families are taking on responsibilities for 
their loved ones who are sick, recovering from surgery or 
dying in the home environment. Caregivers are providing 
long–term care to individuals who suffer from Alzheimer's 
disease, cancer, stroke, spinal injuries or multiple sclerosis. 

The physicians of Texas Medical Association recognize the 
important role family members play in the care of their 
spouses, children, aging parents, and other loved ones. 
"Caregivers have to remember to take care of their own 
health," said Dr. Julie Graves Moy of Austin. The emotional 
and physical stresses of taking care of loved ones can take a 
toll on caregivers and Dr. Moy recommends assistance from 
resources outside of the home such as short–term nursing 
facilities or paid in–home care. "This allows respite for the 
caregiver," she adds. 

Caregivers should be aware of the signs of burnout which 
include not eating properly, becoming more emotional, feeling 
overwhelmed, starting to withdraw, interacting less with 
peers, having less mental focus at work, and displaying a 
disheveled, unkempt appearance. 

Assistance from caregivers comes in many forms. It can be 
providing physical assistance with daily activities from going 
to the bathroom to going to the pharmacy; monitoring medical 
devices and providing emotional, financial, legal, and spiritual 
support. 

According to the National Family Caregivers Association: 
* There are more than 25 million family caregivers in 

America 
.3/4 of all caregivers are women 
* The value of services family caregivers provide free is 

estimated to be at least $194 billion a year 
* By 2020 there will be 14 million elderly in need of long-

term care 
* 61% of "intense" family caregivers (at least 21 hours of 

care a week) have suffered from depression 
* 80% of all home care is provided by family caregivers. 

Information supplied by Texas Medical Association 

Unveiling a new web page are Muenster High School students, from left, Doug Knabe, Casey Walterscheid, 
Karen Cler, Justin Fleitman, John Flusche, and Darren Hennigan. 	Photo by Janie Hartman 

Lindsay ISD Honor Roll 

Legal Fact 
Under Texas' zero tolerance law, it is illegal for a minor 

to drive with any detectable amount of alcohol in his or her 

system. Violating this law carries a fine, driver's license 

suspension and could include jail liner. 
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Muenster High 
School on the web 

Sacred Heart School held its 
usual National Geographic 
.ciety Geography Bee 2000 on 

11 at the Community 
enter. Grades 4 through 8 
ere represented by 49 
mpeting students. All 
udents were well prepared, 
rich made for a very exciting 
ent. Close to 200 questions 
!re asked before the first 
orient was eliminated. 
The Top 10 students were 
termined only after all this 
ar's study questions were 
ked and previous years' 
udy questions were used. The 
cography Bee was required to 

into extra questions to 
'termine the top two 
udents, and then several tie 
eakers were required before 
ate Sepanski was crowned 
hool Champion. Kate took a 
-itten qualifying test for the 

On Jan. 14, the National 
onor Society of Muenster 
igh School sponsored the 

Lational Geographic 
ography Bee. Approximately 

2 students from grades 4-8 
iok the test. The individual 
rade winners were: Cletus 
uhrmann, fourth grade; Brad 
ndres, fifth grade; Leah 
inson, sixth grade; Sean 
uhrmann, seventh grade; and 
.nna Jackson, eighth grade. 
hese students then took a 

\Tational census 
seeds many 
nrorkers 
The national census occurs 
rery ten years. It will occur 
gain in April 2000. The 
aportance of a thorough and 
:curate census cannot be 
,eremphasized since this data 
used in calculating federal 

id state funds for various 
-ograms. A census office has 
,en established in Sherman 
r this area of Texas. 
Census workers have been 
orking for the past two years 

updating census maps, 
idresses, etc. However, more 
orkers are needed. Over 1,800 

1.nsus employees will be hired 
4 .r Cooke, Grayson, and 
annin counties. Salary is 
11.25 an hour plus $0.31 per 
tile reimbursement; crew 
aders receive $12.75 an hour. 
aterested people should call 
38-325-7733. 

Food specialist 
warns about 
snack packs 

COLLEGE STATION— Consum-

rs can buy just about anything in a 
iandy snack pack, microwavable box 

it ready-to-eat bag. But just because a 
nod doesn't require much preparation 

loesn't mean it is necessarily safe to 
at, says a food safety expert at Texas 
olkM University. 

se 
	

Salad mixes and cut veggies are 

tr, 
	vailable in produce sections across 

he country. Prewashed, the bags say 
he contents are 'ready to eat" 

"The best thing you can continue to 

o is wash your fruits and vegetables 
nder running water. It's better to 

eke that extra step," warns Michelle 

edoux, a food and nutrition assistant, 
"exas Agricultural Extension Service. 

Hot dogs are another much-loved 

onvenience food. 

In fact, wieners carrying the poten-
a Hy deadly microbe listeria have been 
lamed in several deaths and many 

-sore cases of listeriosis, the illness 

aused by listeria. 

state-level competition on Jan. 
14. Pending the outcome of the 
state level, Sepanski could 
qualify for the national 
competition. 

The Top 10 Geography Bee 
2000 winners were: School 
Champion, Kathryn Sepanski, 
Grade 8; Runner-Up, Cindy 
Hartman, Grade 8; 3rd, Micah 
Flusche, Grade 5; 4th, Andy 
Davis, Grade 7; 5th, Diana 
Knabe, Grade 6; 6th, Sarah 
Whitecotton, Grade 6; 7th, 
Lauren Sepanski, Grade 4; 8th, 
Adam Dangelmayr, Grade 6; 
9th, David Walterscheid, Grade 
6; 10th, Stephen Davis, Grade 
4. 

Winners by grade were: 
Grade 4 - 1, Lauren Sepanski; 
2, Stephen Davis; 3, Tyler 
Rohmer. Grade 5 - 1, Micah 
Flusche; 2, Zachary Bartush; 3, 
Dustin Hesse. Grade 6 - 1, 

final test to determine the 
overall school winner. That 
award went to Sean 
Fuhrmann. Sean has taken the 
qualifying test for the state 
level competition. 

The individual grade 
winners received a Texas 2000 
Almanac and certificates. Sean 
also received the Webster's 
Collegiate Dictionary and a 
medal. Each student 

Diana Knabe; 2, Sarah 
Whitecotton; 3, Adam 
Dangelmayr. Grade 7 - 1, 
Andy Davis; 2, Christine 
Fetsch; 3, Jon Pels. Grade 8 -
1, Kathryn Sepanski; 2, Cindy 
Hartman; 3, Christina 
Weinzapfel. 

All grade-level winners 
received an award ribbon; the 
top 10 received a medal award, 
with a trophy going to the 
School Champion and Runner-
Up. In addition, the Alumni 
Corporation and Supporters 
gave cash awards of $25, $15, 
and $10 to the top three 
students respectively. Sixth-
grade teacher, Bernadette 
Moritz, served as moderator for 
the event, with teachers, 
Debbie Endres and Glenda 
Mitchell serving as judges 

participating received a 
certificate. 

Assisting 	with 	the 
Geography Bee were Honor 
Society members Casey 
Walterscheid, Allison Endres, 
Darren Hennigan, Kelly 
Felderhoff, Grant Hartman, 
and Pamela Lutkenhaus. 
Assisting with the lettering of 
the certificates were Polly 
Fette, Courtney Haverkamp, 
and Kristin Grewing. 

Third Six Weeks 
"A" HONOR ROLL 

12th Grade: Abbas Ravjani, 
Leah Hermes, Daniel 
Hellinger, Jonathan Whitaker, 
Trent Endres. 

11th Grade: Michael 
Kendall, Deanna Meurer, 
Jonathan Bengfort, Rachel 
Lively, Ashlie Privett, 
Courtney Miller, Nicholas 
Fuhrmann, Jennifer Bengfort, 
Ellen Bezner. 

10th Grade: Sophia 
Rahman, Jennifer Wilson, 
Megan Ward, Nabeel Anwar, 
Faith Skinner, Chelsea 
Brewer, Robin Neu. 

9th Grade: Genevieve 
Knauf, Patrick Zimmerer, Joey 
Arendt, Sara Luttmer, Emmy 
Trammell, Renee Sandmann, 
Jalynn Wilson. 

8th Grade: Lori Kasparek, 
Lindsey Williams. 

7th Grade: Rameez Anwar, 
Jessica Bezner, Joni Erwin, 
Whitney Galubenski, Jacob 
Geray, Cheryl Knabe, Travis 
Reiter, Kelsey Tucker. 

6th Grade: Bradley Arend, 
Mallory Block, Jacob Guiling, 
Dustin Hughes, Elizabeth 
Klement, Diane Knauf, 
Stephanie Metzler, Michelle 
Rauschuber. 

5th Grade: Jillian Bezner, 
Amy Nortman, Chandni Patel, 
Angela Schad, Laura 
Zimmerer, Rachel Zimmerer. 

4th Grade: Madisen 
Burrows, Ashley Caillier, 
Rhea-Claire Galubenski, Keith 
Hermes, Taylor Horn, Jen 
Rauschuber, Jayden Root. 

3rd Grade: Nicholas Bezner, 
Rebecca Brannon, Kelsey 
Hawkins, Rose Hermes, Kayla 
Hess, Kristen Hoberer, Derek 
Hundt, Beverly Knabe, Kelly 
Laux, Nichole Metzler, Amber 
Nortman, Natalie Rose, Jon 
Michael Sweeney, KyLeigh 
Zimmerer. 

2nd Grade: John Block, 
Dianne Brown, Dax Fleitman, 
Dillon Hanson, Haley 
Haverkamp, Brett Hermes, 
Colton Hermes, Josh Hess, 
Shirley Hess, Haley Hughes, 
Greg Luttmer, Cammi Neu, 
Katy Neu, Austin Reiter, 
Conner Skinner. 

1st Grade: Justin Anderle, 
Robert Arend, Aaron Beard, 
Todd Bezner, Jessica Block, 
Llogan Cheaney, Emily 
Conaway, Carolyn Dickerson, 
Bethani Eberhart, Rebecca 
Fuhrmann, Kailyn Gum, 
Kelsey Hermes, Vanessa Hess, 
Geren Horn, Tyler Hundt, 
Jonathan Husman, 
Christopher Klement, Greg 
Knauf, Jessica Krahl, Allison 
Metzler, Katie Nortman, 
Madison Parkhill, Thomas 
Rohmer, Jason Schumacher, 
Savannah Stoffels, Amelia 
Wyrick. 
"A-B" HONOR ROLL 

12th Grade: Adrian Anderle, 
Kelly Beyer, Sarah Collis, Matt 
Crosby, Dalana Cunningham, 
Clay Gallagher, Courtney 
Hoelker, Christine Jordan, 
Brent Krebs, Scott Metzler, 
Diana Stead, Tyler Schneider, 
Leslie Schumacher, Cody 
Secrest, Jo Sparkman, Amanda 
Tamplin, Ryan Tabbert, James 
Thomason, Abby Trammell, 
Sarah Trammell. 

11th Grade: Travis Alfrey, 
Michael Almon, John Bayer, 
Melanie Brown, Anna Beth 
Calhoun. Melissa Carpenter, 
Brent Connett, Dee Ann 
Fuhrmann, Stacey Garner, 

Muenster High School 
unveiled its new web page on 
Wednesday, Jan. 12. The 
Independent Studies class 
developed the new stylish page. 
The new page has been under 
construction since last 
semester. The class is under 
the instruction of Mr. Jerry 
Eckert, and consists of six 
seniors: Karen Cler, Justin 
Fleitman, Doug Knabe, John 
Flusche, Darren Hennigan, and 
Casey Walterscheid. 

The school's web page covers 

Kim Hazle, Angela Kirby, 
Maggie Luttmer, Paul Metzler, 
Karah O'Dell, Jordan Root, 
Adrianne Sandmann, Stacie 
Sandmann, 	Brandon 
Schroeder, 	Svenja 
Stahlschmidt. 

10th Grade: Megan 
Anderson, Tommy Arendt, 
Jacque Bezner, Dominic 
Fuhrmann, Jeff Grindle, Alex 
Haayen, Jeff Kendall, Cathy 
Lusk, Christina Otto, Chad 
Stoffels, Hannah Trammell, 
Kristan Tucker. 

9th Grade: Corrie Crosby, 
Kyle Endres, Josh Franklin, 
Alexandra Hellinger, Kimberly 
Hermes, Elaine Hess, Zachary 
Hoelker, Benjamin Hundt, 
Jonathan Krahl, Chelsea 
Perry, Jamie Price, Adam 
Schreiber, Alex Shauf. 

8th Grade: Philip Bayer, 
Matthew Brennan, Sarah 
Camp, Stephanie English, Sam 
Hellinger, Cody Hess, Ashley 
McPherson, Whitney Neu, 
Kendyl Odell, Mitchell Ward, 
Amber Wolf. 

7th Grade: Kristan 
Alexander, Bradley Anderle, 
Cody Anderle, Allison 
Conaway, Ryan Dickerson, 
Nathan Hermes, Stephanie 
Hermes, Heidi Hess, Brian 
Howard, Dana Huchton, 
Danny Kendall, Trinity Otto, 
Kevin Patrick, Amy Polk, 
Kaylee Privett, Brittany Selby, 
Erin Shears, Mackenzie 
Webster, Ryan Zimmerer. 

6th Grade: Patrick Bayer, 
Megan Benton, Kristopher 
Creed, Matthew Eberhart, 
Olivia Erwin, Leanna Gustine, 
Jonathan Hall, Allison Hundt, 
Adam Kasparek, Adam 
Koelzer, Derick Murray, Ethan 
Reiter, Jacob Root, Clint 
Williams, Erin Wyrick. 

5th Grade: Brittany 
Anderle, Sanaa Anwar, 
Sabrina Bezner, Travis Endres, 
Andrea English, Julie Hanson, 
Levi Hermes, Amanda Hess.  

a wide variety of school 
information. Everything from 
Athletics to Academics to 
MISD staff can be found on the 
school's site. Portions of the 
site are still under 
constructions, but the majority 
of the page is up and running. 

The Independent Studies 
Class encourages everyone to 
check out the product of their 
hard work at 
www.escll.net/schools/Muenst  
erISD/ 

Jeff Hess, Kaileigh Hess, 
Melissa Jordan, Dustin Neu, 
Elizabeth Neu, Heather Odell, 
Joe Otto, Kayla Otto, Karissa 
Reiter, Brian Sandmann, 
Jenny Schroeder, Johnathan 
Zimmerer. 

4th Grade: Krystal Arend, 
Charlotte Bartlett, Mary Kate 
Bayer, Garrett Block, Joey 
Block, Lauren Creed, Elizabeth 
Dieter, Jordan Heilman, Josh 
Heilman, Chelsea Hermes, 
Hillary Hoelker, Michelle 
Husman, Chris Jordan, Lauren 
Krahl, Dillon Ott, Tony 
Patrick, Jaden Perry, Kimberly 
Schumacher, Clayton Starnes, 
Sarah Stoffels, Morgan 
Webster. 

3rd Grade: Kyle Bezner, 
Jacob Sidle, Steven DeGarmo, 
Crystal Dickerson, Chelsea 
Evans, Jay Foster, Ashley 
Hess, Laura Kelley, Matthew 
McPherson, Ian Milunas, 
Kendall Neu, Pooja Patel, 
Casey Shauf, Brianne Sidener, 
Sam Sparkman, Jacob Truitt. 

2nd Grade: Danielle Boren, 
Kymberli Collins, Matt Dieter, 
Gwen Gabel, Ross Jones, Ryan 
Kendall, Adam Krebs, Wes 
Morrison, Kelli Reed. 

let Grade: Regan Gore, 
Austin Hermes, Troy Kirby, 
Macy Perry, Josh Timmins. 

(lust A Though 
Learn to be happy without the 
things we cannot or should not 
have. 

Joy is not in things; it is in 
people. 

Be the first to forgive. 

Correction 
Decorations by Scheids 

was omitted in the article on the 
Muenster Hospital's New Year's 
baby as one of the gift donors. 
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Muenster Hornet Danny Felderhoff 150) wraps his hand around a 
rebound while Justin Fleitman warts for the pass in varsity action 
against Saint Jo. Photo by Dave Fette 

Sacred Heart swim 
team competes at 
Liberty Christian 

GEORGE O'GRADY AGENCY 
Karol Thompson - Agent 

1000  E. Division • 940-759-4571 
Hillcrest Center Muenster, TX 

Competitive Prices 
Fast, Friendly 

Seitimom  

GAINESVILLE 
PROPANE, INC. 

P.O. Box 416 • Gainesville. Texas 76241 

1-800-433-5593 
1-940-668-8518 

0' 

NOW 	from ... 

RE AD RIVER 
THIS VALLEY 

BINGO c:?,  

HOURS: 
Monday, Wednesday, Thursday 

Friday & Saturday 
Early Birds 6:30 pm, Reg. Set 7:30 pm 

Sunday 2pm 

River Valley Bingo. off W. Hwy 82, 
Gainesville, 940/665-5556. 

Sponsors .  Butterfield St. Players. CC Arts Council. DASH 

Your North Texas Embroidery Headquarters 

DESIGN DEPOT 
ADVERTISI 	SPECIALTIES 

CUSTOM EMBROIDERY • CHENILLE PATCHES 

(940) 995-2445 • (940) 995-2373 FAX 
Email: bbmuenster@nortexinfo.net  

Hwy 82 • City Square • PO. Box 8 • Saint Jo, TX 76265 

IK X G 
Local News * Sports * Weather 

6:20 & 7:20 A.M. * 
12:20 & 5:20 P.M. 

HIT 106.5 

PAGE 8 - JANUARY 21, 2000 - THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 

Sports 

Muenster teams win over Sam* 

Sacred Heart School Men's 
and Women's Swimming teams 
both placed fourth overall at 
the Liberty Christian 
Invitational Swim Meet on 
Jan. 15 at the Lewisville 
Aquatic Center in Flower 
Mound. Nine TAPPS schools, 
both Division I and II were 
guests at the meet 

Participants from the Sacred 
Heart Women's team were 
Anne Flusche, Andrea Bauer, 
Sarah Kelley, Sarah Hess, Sara 
Rogers, and Jackie Bartush. 
Men's swimming team 
members are Jeff Hartman, 
Jonathan Bayer, Marty Farrell, 
Daniel Bartush, Chris 
Fuhrmann, and Clint 
Fuhrmann. 

Both teams are currently 
preparing for the State 
Championship meet to be held 
on Feb. 5, at the University of 
Texas in Austin. The swim 
teams will be joined by the 
Sacred Heart Diving teams. 

Bringing home a third place 
in the men's 200 Free Relay 
were Farrell, Fuhrmann, 

Representing the Cooke 
County Soccer Association at 
the 1999 Tournament of 
Champions was the Under 10 
team sponsored by Muenster 
Building Center. By winning 
the Under 10 Division in Cooke 
County this fall, the team 
advanced to the state 
tournament, played on Dec. 4 
and Dec. 5. In the tournament, 
the team won two of the three 

Fuhrmann and Hartman with 
a time of 2:06.41. Fourth place 
honors were achieved by 
Bartush in 100 Fly, 2:11.02; 
Clint Fuhrmann, 100 Free, 
1:19.04; and the Men's 200 
Medley Relay team of Farrell, 
Fuhrmann, Hartman, and 
Fuhrmann with a time of 
2:30.77. 

Fifth place was captured by 
Bauer in the 100 Breast, 
1:28.24; Flusche in the 200 
Free, 2:49.93; Hartman in the 
100 Breast, 1:30.17 and the 50 
Free, 30:15. 

Sixth place honors went to 
Hess, 200 Individual medley, 
3:34.35; the 200 Free Relay 
team of Flusche, Bauer, Rogers 
and Kelley, 2:16.83; and the 
200 Medley Relay team of 
Bauer, Flusche, Rogers and 
Hess, 2:33.72. 

Earning 7th place finishes 
were Flusche, 100 Breast; 
Hess, 500 Free; Bauer, 50 Free; 
and Farrell in the 50 Free and 
100 Back. 

Jackie Bartush placed 8th in 
the 500 Free. 

regular games, earning enough 
points to advance to the 
playoffs. Muenster Building 
finished in the top sixteen after 
a loss to Hurst Euless Bedford 
in the first round. The 
Tournament of Champions 
hosted six hundred boys' and 
girls' teams in four age 
categories. It was held at 
several soccer complexes in the 
Dallas/Fort Worth Area. 

Both Muenster varsity 
basketball teams took district 
wins from Saint Jo last Friday, 
the Hornets winning 37-48 and 
the girls getting an 87-22 
victory. 

The Hornets took the lead in 
the first quarter, then lost it at 
half-time after hitting only free 
throws the second quarter. The 
balls dropped more in 
Muenster's favor the second 
half 30-17, to give the Hornets 
a win. 

Danny Felderhoff had a 
double-double with 21 points 
and 14 rebounds. Greg 
Johnson shooting 80% on field 
.oals added 8 points. Pulling 
own 8 rebounds and getting 

four blocked shots was Justin 
Fleitman, who also contributed 
7 points. Jim Stoffels added 4 
points, pulling down 7 
rebounds, with Chisam Cain, 
Brett Howell, Randy Growing, 
and Mitch Endres each scoring 
2 points. 

T. McCann and Kameron 
McMahan were top scorers for 
the Panthers. 
M 	12 	6 12 18 48 
SJ 	9 11 	8 9 37 

After a close first period, 
Muenster blew the Lady 
Panthers away. "We just had a 
solid performance no matter 
who I put in the ball game," 
stated Coach Jeff Teague. The 
bench scored 22 points. The 
team effort saw all nine 
Muenster players get into the 
scoring column. 

Top performers for the Ladv 
Hornets were Kelly Felderhoff 
with 30 points, 10 steals and 9 
rebounds; Heather Hess had 14 
points, 7 steals and 7 rebounds 
and Allison Endres added d 
points and 5 boards. 

Krystle Sparkman poured in 
13 points Kristie Lutkenhaus 
and Ashley Hess both 
contributed 6, Brittany 
Haverkamp 4 Diane Britain 3, 
and Ashley Klement 2. 

The Lady Hornets had 31 
steals compared to only 12 

A highlight for Rashae 
Dangelmayr and four of her 
teammates from Gym-ette 
Gymnastics in Thackerville, 
Oklahoma was a trip to Las 
Vegas, Nevada. Coached by 
Joette Heim, they competed in 
the Tiger Paw Gymnastic 
Invitational. The event was 
held at the University of 
Nevada Las Vegas on Jan. 14. 

Competing as a Level 4 
gymnast in the 6 to 7 year old 
division, Rashae won her first 
All-Around Medal. She placed 
first on beam and vault, and 
second on floor and uneven 
bars. The vault was a 
significant win because she fell 
on her first vault, but came 
back on the second vault with 
an 8.25 score. 

Karly Holder, a teammate, 
also won the All-Around Medal 
in the 9 year old division. The 
team placed second in points, 
in Level 4 at the meet. Rashae 
also competed at Colorado 
Springs in October. She went 
on to the finals in uneven bars. 
This season she has advanced 
to a Level 5 for state 
competition. 

Accompanying her to Las 
Vegas were her parents, Mike 
and Kerry Dangelmayr, and 
grandparents Patsy and Paul 
Dangelmayr and Mickey and  

turnovers and shot 70% from 
the line. 
M 	11 30 22 24 87 
SJ 	5 2 6 9 22 

Kelly Felderhoff shoots out of a 
Saint Jo crowd for the Lady 
Hornet Varsity. Dave Fette photo 

Benny Haverkamp. After the 
competition, the gymnasts and 
some of the families attended 
the RCA Gymnastic Challenge. 
Held at the MGM Grand 
Arena, this was a qualifying 
meet for America's Cup. There 
they saw American and 
International gymnasts 
compete. 

Rashae Dangelmayr is a 
second grader at Sacred Heart 
School, and is in her second 
year of gymnastic competition 
with Gym-ettes. In addition, 
she is a member of their 
competitive All Star Pee Wee 
Cheerleading Squad. After 
winning a NCA competition at 
TWU, they have been invited 
to the National Finals in 
Dallas. 

OCYC Football) 

The Hoopsters (Muenster 1) fifth 
and sixth grade girls took to the court 
Jan. 14 against the VFW Post 1922. 
Halley Broyles was the high scorer 
with 5 points. Going to the hoop for 4 
points each were Jact Ember, Krystal 
Wolf, and Danielle Bindel. Kellie 
Brown put in 2. Others contributing to 
the 19-6 victory were Jenni Endres and 
Meagan Felderhoff 

The Tigers hosted Fairhill 
last week Thursday and turned 
out a 96-28 victory. The boys 
looked good again with 50% 
shootine and only 11 
turnovers; said Coach Kelly 
Bayer. "It s good to have a win 
like this." 

The Tigers now 6-14 
lowered Fairhill 's season record 
to 2-15, with every Sacred 
Heart player contributing 
points to the victory. 

Leading the scoring was 
Marty Farrell with 18 points, 
Luke Endres with 16. and Jon 

Tigerette Anne Flusche launches 
a 3—point shot against Fairhill. 

Photo by Dave Fene 
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Yosten with 13 point 
Matthew Nasche added 8 wi 
Mike Bayer and Jack tiff - 

 each getting 7. Ken Grewir 
Chris Smith, and Steph 
Hofbauer put in 6 apiece, Cli 
Fuhrmann scored 4, Chi 
Fuhrmann 3, and Dan 
Bartush 2. 

Hofbauer and Yosten w, 
leading rebounders for t 
Tigers. Farrell grabbed 
steals, and Endres was 3 foi 
in 3-point attempts. 
SH 32 15 26 23 
F 	3 	7 	8 10 

Tigerettes 
whip Warrior 

The Tigerettes got their .` • 
district win Tuesday night 
improve their season record)! 
21-1, the only loss to the Val 
View Lady Eagles. "We hat 
great first half as we or 
missed 11 total shots include 
free shots," bragged Coach J 
LeBrasseur on their 89- 
beating of Lakehill. 

Sacred Heart set the boar 
on fire the first half taking 
30-2 lead the first pen, 
extending their lead to 62-10 
half-time. 

A Felderhoff Ka la Felderho again 1 
the Tigerettes in scorn 
putting in 27 points. Andr 
Bauer added 14, Sarah Hi ; 
11, with Audrey Barnhill a 
Anne Flusche each getting 
Jennifer Hess scored 8, Joan 
Gehrig 5, Raney Bauer 4, a 
Jana Truebenbach 2. 
SH 30 32 11 16 Ea 

2 	4 	0 1 

Be careful 
driving to 
and from 'Here E l 

 the games! 

Muenster Building Center 
soccer team advances to play-offs 

Rashae Dangelmayr competes 
with gymnastics team 

I 	12 
lc -  NIP 

411 

Chris Fuhrmann shoots for the Sacred Heart Tigers while Steph 
Hofbauer and Daniel Bartush move in. 	 Photo by Dave Fe 

Tigers top Fairhil 
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MUENSTER TOURNAMENT 
Muenster 36 Nocella 23 

The JV Lady Hornets took a victory 
their first game of the tournament. 
van girls contributed points to the 
n, led by Megan Lippe with 10, and 
nanda Felderhoff and Krystal Hale 9 
.ints, with Pamela Lutkenhaus, 
ystal Lutkenhaus, and Lacy Endres 
ch getting 2, and Lisa Felderhoff 1. 

6 	8 12 	9 M 
2 	9 	0 	12 	23 

Muenster 33 Era 27 
Krystal Hale and Lisa Felderhoff 

th put in 9 points to lead the Lady 
Iii ornets to a championship victory. 

utres added 7, Lippe 6, and C. 
Itkenhaus 2 for Muenster. The game 
mained close, with leaders switching 
'm team to team. A 19-12 second half 
ore gave Muenster the championship. 

6 	8 	9 	10 	99 
5 	10 	5 	7 	Z7 

Muenster JV tournament action 
Sacred Heart 45 Era 51 

It was a high shooting match in 
round one action. The girls played 
hard, it just was our inability to 
connect from the free throw line," said 
Coach Jon LeBrasseur, Sacred Heart 
shot under 501,  while Era hit 75%. 

Sara Sepanski and Lilly Nasche led 
the young Tigerettes with 13 and 11 
points. Elizabeth Fette added 9, 
Jennifer Hoedebeck 4, Kristen 
Zimmerer and Katherine Bartush 3 
each, and Mary Jane Callahan 2. 
SH 6 16 9 14 
E 14 	13 	14 	10 	51 

Sacred Heart 30 Nocona 57 
In round two, the Tigerettes fell. "It 

was a hard fought game. We played 
very hard just came up a little short, -
said Coach LeBrasseur. 

Sepanski and Nasche each added 8 
points. Fette put in 5, Hoedebeck 4, 
Zimmerer 3, and Alisha Cochran 2. 
SH 	9 	8 	6 	7 30 
N 8 	9 	14 	6 37 

0 

Lady Knights fall 
to district leaders 

Game Warden Notes 
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ani lore points for Sacred Heart Jr. 
igh. 	Photo by Dave Fette 

. 89  1t right, a wild ball goes out of 
he reach of John Sturm (40) and 
(irk Hartman, but right into the 
sands of Daniel Russell (21). Also 
ieen in action with Saint Jo is 
Kyle Endres (22). 

Photo by Janie Hartman 

[ere Big Lizard, Lizard 
An Orange County game 

/arden responded to a call 
oncerning a two-foot alligator 

- hat had crawled into a two- 
aot-deep, wood-lined ditch at 
iuPont Sabine River Works. 
activity was at a standstill 
,ntil the "dangerous" reptile 
ould be removed. Officials at 
he refinery feared that an 
mployee might be bitten if he 
ttempted to rescue the 'gator. 
'he warden explained that 

'

alligators respond well to 
henna sausage even better 
han thumbs, and he was able 
o make a live capture 

Finding Religion... 
Less than a week later, the 

same warden received another 
alligator call. He and a warden 
from a neighboring county 
responded to a call for help 
from the Liberty Baptist 
Church in Bridge City. A 
seven-foot alligator was 
seeking refuge at the church -
perhaps hoping to take up 
residence in the baptismal. The 
alligator, dubbed "Double Ugly" 
because of a damaged nose 
which gives the appearance of 
two snouts, was captured 
under great protest and 
released in a nearby wildlife 
management area. 

JV 
Action 

Sacred Heart 32 Nocona 13 
Monday night, the Tigerettes took a 

win. We started slow but our bench 
really picked up. It was a complete 
team effort for the win," said Coach 
Jon LeBrasseur. Crystal Hess dropped 
in 8 points for Sacred Heart. Elizabeth 
Fette added 7, Lilly Nasche 6, Kristen 
Zimmerer 5, Katherine Bartush 4, and 
Alisha Cochran 2. 
SH 	4 10 	9 	9 32 
N 3 	4 	2 	4 	13 

Muenster 'Red" 38 
Saint Jo 37 

The junior varsity red team got a 
win from the Lady Panthers last week 
in a hard, close match. Leading scores 
were exchanged between the teams 
with a 32-32 tie after 4 quarters. In 
overtime Muenster put in 6 to Saint 
Jo's 5 to take the win. 

Megan Hennigan scored 15 points, 
11 from the free throw line and four in 
overtime. Ann Graham added 7 points, 
Jamie Gerstberger 5, with Kacie 
Garcia and Malony Gieb each getting 
4, and Terri Wimmer a 3-pointer. 
Muenster was 12 of 20 from the charity 
strip. 
M 2 12 9 9 6 38 
SJ 4 6 15 7 5 37 

LINDSAY TOURNAMENT 
Lindsay 48 Callisburg 42 

The junior varsity Knights squeezed 
by their opening tournament game. 
After taking a commanding first 
quarter lead, Lindsay let the Cats in to 
the game, being out-scored two 
quarters, but held on to their lead for 
the win. 

Mitch Creed led Lindsay on the 
scoreboard with 18 points. Josh 
Goldsmith added 10, Joe Arendt 6, 
Rhett Rimmer 5, Adam Anderle 4, 2 
each from Dominic Fuhrmann and Jeff 
Grindle, and a free throw from Ben 
Hundt. 
L 17 	7 	10 	14 	48 
C 	5 	9 	10 	18 	42 

Lindsay 63 Slidell 33 
The Knights took the tournament 

championship behind the shooting 
power of Rimmer, Creed, and, 
Goldsmith. Lindsay had a seven point 
advantage at half-time, then outscored 
the Hounds 21-4 in the 3rd period to 
clinch the victory. 

Rimmer scored 17 points, with 
Creed and Goldsmith each adding 16. 
Arendt and Grindle put in 2 apiece to 
round out the scoring. 

11 	10 	21 	11 
S 5 	9 	4 	15 	33 

Boyd's Lady Yellowjackets 
maintained their district 
leadership with a win over the 
Lindsay Lady Knights Friday 
night at Boyd, 67-47. Leading 
21-12 at the end of one and 38 -
23 at the half the Jackets saw 
the Lady Knights come battling 
back to within 6 in the final 
quarter, winning all but the 
last two minutes of the second 
half. 

Karah O'Dell led Lindsay in 
points with 18, while Jo 
Sparkman contributed 12 
points, 4 steals, and 4 assists 
for the evening. Amber Selby 
added 6 points and 8 rebounds 
and Deanna Meurer had 4 
points, 7 rebounds, and 4 
steals. 

Other scorers were Amanda 
Tamplin with 4, Maggie 
Luttmer with 2 and Jacque 
Bezner with 1. Courtney 
Hoelker led rebounding with 9. 

Three Lady Knights scored 
in the double digits Tuesday 
night in Nocona, contributing 
to the 66-38 district win over 
the Ladv Indians. 

Karah O'Dell led with 15 
points, Amber Selby added 13. 

Muenster 7th 25 
Saint Jo 23 

After what seemed it would never 
end, the 7th grade girls took a 25-23 
win from Saint Jo Monday night. After 
scoring a dozen the first quarter, 
baskets were hard to find, for both 
Muenster and Saint Jo. 

Joanna Felderhoff was high point 
maker in the contest with 10 points. 
Tara Swirczynski and Candice 
McCrary each added 4, with Shelbi 
Jolliff, Whitney Watson and Stevie 
Klement getting 2 apiece. Kallie 
Gerstberger dropped in a point. 
M 	12 	2 	6 	5 
SJ 	7 	8 	6 	3 Si 

Muenster 7th 43 
Saint Jo 20 

Nine Young Stingers put points on 
the board Monday night in Saint Jo. 
After taking an 18-2 first quarter lead, 
Muenster had a slow second period, 
but kept the lead, extending it 
throughout the night. 

John Fredrick led Muenster in 
points with 9. Russell Endres, Derek 
Felderhoff, and Justin Wolf each added 
6 points. Dustin Felderhoff, Chase 
Cain, and Sean Fuhrmann scored 4 
apiece with Craig Hopper and A.J. 
Fleitman each putting in 2. 

Sutton of Saint Jo had 15 points, 
M 	18 	3 14 	8 	43 
SJ 	2 	5 	2 	11 	AI 

Diana Felderhoff (1 0) keeps 
pressure on a Lady Cub 
preventing a shot. Robyn Hermes 
is also pictured. 

Photo by Janie Hartman 

and Jo Sparkman 12. Amanda 
Tamplin dropped in 7, Dee Ann 
Fuhrmann 5-, and 4 apiece from 
Maggie Luttmer and Hannah 
Trammell. Alex Haayen, 
Courtney Hoelker, and Deanna 
Meurer each added 2. 
L 	13 24 13 16 66 
N 	16 6 5 11 38 

Knights struggle 
in earlier contest 
The Lindsay boys tangled 

with Peaster on Jan. 7 ending 
the game with a 39-82 defeat. 
The teams were even the first 
quarter, then the Greyhounds 
pumped in 31 points the second 
period and out-scored the 
Knights 37-11 the second half. 

Cody Secrest and Abbas 
Ravjani led Lindsay's scoring 
with 12 and 10points. James 
Thomason added 6 Brad 
Minnix 3 and 2 each from 
Trent Endres, Tommy Arendt, 
Jon Bengfort, and Nicholas 
Fuhrmann. 
L 	13 15 8 3 39 
P 	14 31 20 17 82 

3 
Deann Dangelmayr reaches for a 
rebound. Photo byJanle Hartman 

Muenster 8th 68 
Saint Jo 16 

Melinda Walterscheid dropped in a 
dozen buckets for 24 points to lead the 
Lady Hornets in their district 
slaughter of the Lady Panthers. Alisha 
Walterscheid added 9, with Kristi 
McAden and DeAnn Dangelmayr each 
adding 6. Robyn Hermes put in 5, 
Rachel Clark and Kristen Koesler 3 
apiece and Chelsea Felderhoff 2. Diana 
Felderhoff saw good defensive action. 
M 	15 	14 	14 	14 	513 
SJ 	5 	7 	1 	3 	16 

Muenster 8th 42 Saint Jo 19 
The Stingers got another victory in 

the Panthers Pit. Scoring started slow 
with a 20-11 half-time score. Daniel 
Russell set a new team record as high 
scorer with' 20 points, 10 coming from 
fourth quarter lay-ups. Kirk Hartman 
added 10 points, Jared Ledbetter 8, 
and Kyle Endres 4. 

Good defense by Joseph 
Dangelmayr, Nathan Sicking, John 
Sturm, and Andrew Milburn kept 
Saint Jo's scoring low. 
M 	10 	10 	10 	12 	dit 
Sf 	6 	5 	6 	2 	19 

LINDSAY TOURNAMENT 
Muenster 37 Sanger 22 

In round one, the Lady Stingers 
grabbed a victory. Joanna Felderhoff 
put in 10 points. Shelbi Jolliff and 
Kallie Gerstberger each added 8, 
Whitney Watson put in 4, Tara 
Swirczynski 3, and 2 apiece from 
Stevie Klement and Kristen Hess. 
M 12 11 8 6 37 
S 7 	6 	3 	6 22 

Muenster 5 Saint Mary'. 35 
Muenster's shooting game died in 

the championship game of the 
tournament. After falling 21-0 the first 
quarter, the Lady Hornets could only 
get 5 points the whole game. Felderhoff 
put in 4, and Watson 1. 
M 	0 	2 	2 	1 	6 
SM 	21 	6 	4 	4 M 

There's Just Something 
About Alligators And 
Churches... 

Port Arthur police asked 
wardens to follow-up an 
incident involving a man that 
had been bitten by an alligator. 
The man discovered the 5 1/2-
foot alligator in the bed of a 
pickup outside of a church, 
thought it was cute and 
decided to pet it. Wrong move. 
The warden found the owner of 
the truck who admitted to 
possessing the alligator. The 
owner said that he felt bad 
about the man getting bitten 
and promised not to pick up 
any more alligators. 

• 

Above: Michael Endres jumps to 
free his shot over an Era 
defender. Photo by Dave Fette 

At Left: Sarah Sepanski set up a 
3–pointer for the Tigerette JV. 

Photo by Dave Fette 

At right: Elliott Klement makes 2 
points for the Hornet JV while 
Tyler Walterscheid waits for the 
rebound. Photo by Dave Fette 

t 

Above: Jack Riffle drives down 
the court during the Muenster JV 
Tournament. Photo by Dave Fette 

At left: Lacy Endres shoots from 
the corner for the Lady Hornet 
JV. Photo by Dave Fette 

63 

Candice McCreary (34) a 7th grade Lady Stinger blocks an attempted 
Saint Jo shot. Also pictured are Callie Gerstberger (23) and Joanna 
Felderhoff. Photo by Janie Hartman 

(  Junior High Action_) 
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VICTORIAN  LACE 
Brighton, Lady Primrose & 

Eileen West Lingerie 

For septx Systems 
ROEBIC K-37 
Septic Tank 

Liquefier 

A untie Irearmeni ol 
tius product Praven. 
camping ol a mole 

tank and a guaranteed 
eXecem Mr one whole year 

Community Lumber Co. 
WOE Division • Muenster 759-2248 

6.7••••'" 

218 N. Main 	 Muenster, Texas 76252 

(940) 759-2363 
Email. texcat4noriminfo net 

(itsdeieu,sieum 	 NfirelasoteSenets 

CARPENTER 
WORK WANTED 

Also odd jobs 
Reasonable rams 

Ernie Martin 759-4650 

TENDER LOVING CARE 
Day Care Center. 759-4964. 
 • • x 

OTTO 
DOZER SERVICE 
Mike Otto - Lindsay 
1-800-882-DIRT 

* Septic Tank * 

Cleaning 

H8&11 Vacuum 
Service 

Residential 	Mobile 

* 668.7268 or 736.3448 * 

V-Pe ri4#tke 

sopies! 

Secretary/Receptionist 
Cooke Co. Farm Bureau 

in 

Looking for 2 fulltime 

secretaries. Computer skills a 

must. Contact Raymond Root, 

665-1763 for more information. 

	  1.4 

HELP WANTED 

Part-Time Waitress 
2 - 3 Days/Week 

Crafty Olde Germ. 
Apply in person: 9:30am-1 I ate 

216 N. Main 

Muenster 
	 ire 

HELP WANTED 
Cooks, Dishwashers and 

Busse's. 
Evening Shift Cook needed 

Apply in person . 

Rohmer's Restaurant 

UM' 
STATE INSPECTED meat 
processing plant. Bring in 
your animal rues or Thurs. 
Fischer's Meat Market, 
759-42ll.  „.„ 

WAYNE'S PAINTING 
Residential - Commercial 

Tape Bed - Acoustic Work 

WAYNE LANGSTON 

940-759-5043 	- 

Mobile 940427-1432 - 

Carpet Cleaning- 

Window Washing 

FREE ESTIMATES 

Mark Wagner 
9 9 5-2812 

Help Wanted 

MEM 
St. Jo Nursing Center 

is hiring CNA's, 

LVN's, all shifts. For 
information call Jill at 

995-2302. 

DRIVERS NEEDED 

Good Dieing Record 

Klement Ford, Muenster 

759-2244. 

IMMEDIATE 
kitchen help 

needed and 

Kitchen & Wait 
Staff 

Apply in person at 

The Center 
Restaurant 

ZACK BURKETT CO. 
BOX 40 

GRAHAM, TEXAS 76450 

Employment available with ZACK 
BURKETT CO. Laborers needed at the 
jobsite located on FM 677 in Saint Jo, 
Texas. Please call 940-549-0436 - Pat 
Odom for an application or go by the job 
and ask for the Supt. We especially 
encourage minorities and women to apply. 
At this time we are needing laborers. Zack 
Burkett Co. is an equal opportunity 
employer. 

rairMMIMIL egal Notices 

The City of Muenster invites bids for preparation of approximarsi 
2,450 sq yd street and for paving approximately 52,000 square yard 

of streets with gravel and oil. Detailed information is available at Cii> 
Hall, 400 N. Main St. Muenster, TX 76252, or at 940 759 -2236. Bid is 
to include labor and materials. excluding gravel. Bidders should 

submit their bids in sealed envelopes with the words "PAVING 

STREET BID" written on the front of the envelopes so as to arrive at 

City Hall by 1:30 p.m. on Monday. February 7. 2000. Steve Broyles 

may be reached at 940.759.2236 to answer questions. City reserves 

the right to refuse all bids. 
I 1,21. 

BID INVITATION FOR CHLORINE GAS CYLINDERS 

The City of Muenster invites bids for 150 - lb chlorine gas 

cylinders and monthly pick up/replacement Annual consumption 

is approximately 5.400 lbs. Bidders should submit their bids in 

sealed envelopes-with the words "CHLORINE GAS BID" 

wrinen on the front of the envelopes--to anive at City Hall by 
1:30 p.m. on Monday, February 7, 2000. Steve Broyles may be 
reached at 940-759-2236 to answer questions. 

0=5 
State Inspection 

WHOLESALE & 
RETAIL 

MEATS  
custom Staughtenng 
Custom Processing 

Wild Game Processing 

Smoked Sausage 

Every Day: 
Hamburger 	$1.39 lb. 
305. Hamburger $1.29 lb. 

309 Box Beel . 554.95 
110 Ham., 1/3 Mull, Inasmo 

HAM • BACON • HA, OR 
QUARTER CARCASS • AWARD 
WINNING SMOKED SAUSAGE • 
SUMMER SAUSAGE • CUSTOM 

SIAUGHTERING BY API, 

759-2744 
on N Meerura • Mwn, 

Automobiles For Sale 

Ahh. 

►  ■L 

1985 CHEVROLET CAPRICE 

4 Door. 5950 OBO. W.I. Luke 
759.4458. 

OVER 60 USED CARS 
AND TRUCKS available 
all the time at Holiday 
Chevrolet in Whitesboro. 
668-8152 or 0031 564-3551. 
	 110.x 

1991 THUNDERBIRD 

Very clean, motor is 3.8V6. 

Almost new tires. 54.400. 

759-4082 or 736-5930. 
	  111.71 

Two 1975 CHEW 

HALF TON PICKUPS. Must sell. 

Make an offer. After 6 p.m. 
call 940-458-4131. 

1989 ESCORT GT 
5 speed. 2 door, Runs good . 

Excellent gas mileage. 51.500. 

940-6654698. 

FOR HOME DELIVERY OF 
Fort Worth Star Telegram 

or Gainesville Daily 
Register, call DALE 

WHITE, 940-668-2743 

For LIFE INSURANCE, 
IRA'S or TAX DEFERRED 
ANNUITIES, call Phillip 
Flusche, Catholic Life lemur-

ance at 759-5010 ow. 

AVON: To buy or sell 
Avon, call Evelyn Sicking, 
759-4388. .1-a• 

• SPACE FOR RENT • 
OFFICE OR RETAIL 

Old Theatre Mall, 213 N. Main 

Call Lora at 759-4080 
	  1114.4 

I BUY MORTGAGES, 
940-8724543. 

MOBILE HOME FOR RENT: 
2 bedroom, a block from 
school on N. Walnut. Phone 
759.2938, Jerome Pagel. 

   

3.3 

   

OFFICE SPACES for Rent: 
Hofbauer Building. 403 E. 
Division. Call 759-4497 i,  „. 

 

	 Seel 

   

       

Coin/Tar HOME 
on approx. 4 acres 3 

bedroom. 2 bath. CH/A.  
Completely remodeled 
Located northwest of 

Muenster. Owners/agent 
579,500 Don Hobbs Real 

Estate 940-668-8523 , , 

RESIDENTIAL BUILDING 
Locations are available 
in Community Estates, 
Lindsay, Texas, including 
25 platted locations, paved 
streets and underground 
utilities. For more information, 
contact Community Lumber 
Company, Muenster, 759-2248. 

Brushy Mound Real Estate 
Member: North Texas Real 'tr 

Estate Information Service servo 
* * * * * MLS 

♦ Price Reduced on 3.92 acres at corner of 

Highway 82 &Ash St. in Muenster. Zoned 
Commercial. Motivated seller - $55,000. 

• Wonderful j1/J.•".------ rge corner lot_ 3 

or4 bear°  SOLD, car garage . 
Nicely land 	 - -- 
Christine Beaulieu Weinzapfel 

E-Mail: brushymound@nortexinfo.net  
940-759-4749 

	0 
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Kim Stewart 
and Mike Hesse 

• 
210 N Main Muenster 

759 - 4112 

all N. Main 	 Muenster 

BRIDAL 
SELECTIONS FOR 

•lCitn Stewart 4,  
Mike fiesse 

Craft Olde 
German 

216 N. Main 
Muenster, Texas 

759-2505 

WANT TO BUY 
- Want to buy - 

Used Outdoor Cooler 

Call Lora. 759 -4080. 
12164 

WM," Hide  Vehrean 

se Tea gittea 
Sr Mon. - Cresson/ Poffano Chicken 	

424. 

Tues. - Beef Parmesan Patties over Angd 
Hair Pasta 

Wed: -Stu Bakei Potatoes 
'Thurs. - 	en Stir Try 
Ffi- - G • Chicken Caesar Sand 
Sat. - Selections from Our menu 

Ilours 11 a. I77- - 2 p.m_ • Saturday 11-2 
216 Noon Main • Muenster • 759-2519 

1989 CADILLAC SEDAN 

DEVILLE 

White w/burgundy leather 

intenor. Excell nt condition.  

Must see to up reciate 1207 

Belmont in Gainesville 

940.66 -0580 

A new Huffy Boy's bicycle, a 

Christmas gift, was taken from 

our home on the evening of 

Tuesday. Jan. 11. Bike 0 all- 

chrome with blue metallic rims 

and black sear Reward offered 

Information, please 

call 759-4898. 

OUTPOORS 
T I P S 

HIA‘ TO HIDE FROM FISH 
We all know that fish 

"hear" vibrations in the 
water. Motoring right into 
the fishing hole, bumping 
around In the boat. even 
heavy footed stomping along 
the bank - all will spook fish 
out of a feeding mood and 
into heavy cover. Quietly 
ease up to your fishing spot 
to catch more fish. 

Fish see very well in an 
upward cone and many of 
their predators, Including 
you. come at them from 
above. This is another good 
reason to lay back and cast to 
cover. rather than zooming 
right in on top of the fish. 
Small-pond anglers should 
keep a low profile and stream 
anglers should work 
upstream, coming up behind 
fish, which face upstream 
waiting for a meal. 

Hardly anyone thinks of 
camouflage relating to fish-
ing. However, clothing that 
blends with the background 
is a big help in close quarters. 
Moving slowly and cautious-
ly. while staying close to 
streamslde and bank cover, 
will up your odds on small-
water fish. 

FOR RENT. HIGH PRESSURE 
Sprayer, 2500 lbs. For 
removing paint etc. 
Muenster Building Center. 
421 N. Main. 759-2232 

BID INVITATION FOR 

STREET PAVING 

-i1 0 1111 
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Primary Election - Tuesday, March 14 

DISTRICT ATTORNEY  

Janelle M. Haverkamp 
Republican 

Incumbent 

District Attorney 
Pad taloned by 

terTetre PD•trm 
 Gnome,. Team 71140 

TAX ASSESSOR 
COLLECTOR 

Billie Jean Knight 
Democrat 

Incumbent 

Tax Assessor Collector 
Pad Named Ad 

11111m Ion Knmer 
sea McCao Rd 

Camomile Team 762.0-na76 

COUNTY 
ATTORNEY 

Tanya S. Davis 
Republican 

Incumbent 

County Attorney 

 Truauv 
Pad PWaraMby 

Yarn Henry. 
5 le Henry Sc 

Lmdm• Teem 7M1130 

DISTRICT 1UDGF 

Jerry W. Woodlock 
Democrat 

Incumbent 

District Judge 
Pad Whom, Ad 

zoi N Man 
Almnuer. Team 7e152 

CONSTABLE 
PRECINCT 1 

David Tharp 
Republican 

Incumbent 

Constable, Precinct I 
Pad Pelted Ad 

Dmum a=n Treasorer 

Undmy, Dui 76250 

Classified 
Deadline is 
Wednesday 

at Noon 

 

Real Estate For  Sale/Rent 

1.1r7711.7= 
Mmr-di= MM AM M■I■ 

IN STOCK 
Electrical - Plumbing 
Paneling - Roofing 

Hardware - Water Pumps 
Heating - Air Conditioning 

We can recommend an installer 

Muenster Building 
Center, Inc. 
Muenster, 759-2232 

    

BECKER 

 

DOZER SERVICE 
Ponds • Clearing Land and more! 

Paul Becker 	 7592803 
Mueneter, TX 76252 	 or 759-4047 

  

  

       

       

 

NORTH TEXAS COMMUNICATIONS 

  

       

 

Twat 
Communir at 

Cornpan 

• Southwestern Bell Wireless 
• Pagers • Internet • CATV 

• Long Distance Service 

205 N. Walnut • Muenster • 736 -2255 
2200 E. Hoy. 82. Gainesville • 665-3347 

 

HESSE-SCHNIEDERJAN 
num! HEATING AND AIR CONDITIONING 

397 Hwy. 373 N, Muenster 
Blown Insulation • Sheet Metal • Heating & Cooling • Heat Pumps 

940-759-2787 TACLB-010802-E 	940-759-4079 

PAUL J. HESS NO. 1 
Kansas Alfalfa hay for sale . 
Any amount. 665-7601 or 
665-9228 

OUR ADS SUCCEED! 

773. JAMIE FLORES sik/a JAMIE MALDONADO, Respondent. 

and to all whom it may concern. 

"You have been sued. You may employ an attorney. If you or your 

attorney do not file a wrinen answer with the clerk who issued this 

citation by 1000 a. m. on the Monday next following the expiration of 

twenty days after you were served this citation. a default Judgment 

may be taken against you." 

The Second Amended Original Petition in Suit Affecting Parent 

Child Relationship and Petition to Establish Paternity was filed in 

the Court of Cooke County. Texas, on the 6th day of January. A D 

2000, by FRANK RAUSCHUBER and BARBARA 

RAUSCHUBER numbered 98-443, and entitled 'In the Interest of 
ERICA MARIA FLORES. a child.' The sun is a request for the 
Court to establish paternity of the child and to appoint petitioners as 
sole managing conservators of the child. 

The following child is subject of the suit: ERICA MARIA 
FLORES, female, DOB: 11/29/96, in Gainesville, TX. 

The Court has the authority in this suit to enter any judgment or 
decree in the child's interest which will he binding on you including 
the termination of the parent -child relationship. the deiemanwion 

paternity and the appointment of a conservator with authority to 
consent to the child's adoption. 

Issued and given under my hand and Seal of said Court at 
Gainesville, Texas, this the 6th day of January 2000 

Attest. 

Pat Payne. Clerk 
235th District Court, 

Cooke County. Texas 
/s/Joy Huddleston. Deputy 

OUTPOORS 
T 
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When you are hot and 
thirsty, a clear. babbling 
brook sure looks inviting. 
Don't yield to this tempta-
tion. Drinking untreated 
surface water. even In 
remote wilderness locations. 
can be hazardous to your 
health. 

The most common water-
borne diseases are caused by 
the bacteria E. coil and the 
protozoan Giardia lamblia. 
Both cause moderate to 

Wegislry. 

76th r3/eatarl 

& 3.6%e _Weise 

M .& '3 deutetv 

problem. so  mention any 
outdoor 'water sampling if 
you visit a physician due to 
gastro - intestinal distress. 

If you must drink or wash 
fruits and dishes in local 
surface water, boil the water 
or treat it with approved 
water purification chemicals. 
One of the water-purification 
filter kits is a wise invest-
ment for serious outdoor 
enthusiasts. 

	

DOV 1%1 \ 	I‘ \TER 

severe gasirocilict 
rhea, abdominal cramps. 
nausea. etc. E. coil hits fast 
but may clear up on Its own. 
Prescription antibiotics 
speed recovery. 

Giardia is more persistent 
and pernicious. Incubation 
time is 10 to 14 days. 
Symptoms are moderately 
severe and may come and go. 
It Is very debilitating and 
requires medical interven-
tion. Misdiagnosis can be a 

QUALITY PRINTING & PUBLISHING SINCE 11936 



(  It's A Stan 
Monthly Report 

by the T 	Agricultural ) 
Statistics Service 

GAINESVILLELIVESOCIriIIIICET, INC. 
"North Texas' Leading Auction Sale" 	(940) 665 -4367 

Lahiwcight Stem and Bolen weady Fettler Stem and Hearn 52 to 55 Iowa Packer Cows and bulls 
ocady Bred Cows $50 to 175 higher. Paws 120 htshcr 

Sold at Friday's sale were 1,876 head of cattle compared to 1,862 head acetic the previous week. 
Tuesday. the market conducted the sale 01133 goats, 80 sheep And 95 boas. The numbers for last week were 11 I. 
%and 210 respecovely Results follow.  

	

Feeder Steers (per lb.) 	utility 	cutter..35- 

	

200-300 lbs.. N. 1.1.05- 	 .42. 
1A0, Nos. 2 & 3. 78-1 05. Stocker Cows (per head) 

	

300-400 lb,: No 1, 1.05- 	Pregnancy-tested. 3- to 9- 

	

1.30; Nos. 2 & 3, .75-1.05, 	ycar.olds - large mama, 5600- 

	

400-500 lbs., No. I. 1.00- 	 5780; medium frame, 5450- 

	

1.26; Nos. 2 & 3, .70-1.00; 	$600. 

	

500-600 lbs.: No I, .95- 	Cow-calf pairs w/calves 

	

1.00; No, 2 & 3..70-.95; 	under 250 lbs. - large frame. 

	

600-70016s.: No. 1,15-.98; 	5625-5800; medium frame, 
Nos. 2 & 3, 65-.85;700-800 5500-0625. 

	

lbs.: No I, 38-.88; Nos. 2 	Holstein baby calves. $36 
& 3, 60-38. 	 575; Crossbreds. 575-5220. 

	

Feeder Heifers (per lb.) 	Barrows & Gills: US 01, 

	

200300 lbs.: No. 1..91- 	230-270, 30-.32; US 02, 220- 
1.10; Nos. 2 & 3, .70-.91; 

	

300-400 lbs.: N. 1, .88- 	F«ders (per head): 

	

1.06; Nos. 2 & 3, .70-.88; 	100-175 lbs., 045-550; 25-90 

	

400-500 lbs., No 1,.85- 	lbs.. 515-530. 

	

1.00; No, 2 & 3, .65-.85; 	 Sows: 

	

500-60011n.: No. 1, .80-.92; 	Feeder, 400 00 less. .22-.25; 

	

Nos. 2 & 3_65-.80;600-700 	Light wt.. 400-500..25-.32; 

	

lbs.: No 1, .78-.84; Nos. 2 	Med. wt., 500-600. 35-40; 

	

& 3..61-.78; 700-800 lb,: 	Heavy wt. 606up, .40-.42. 

	

No. 1, 30-.79; N.. 2 & 3, 	Boars: 
.55-.70. 	 305 lb. -up, .05-08; 200-300 

	

Slaughter Cattle (per lb.) 	lbs., 07-.10; Light wt, .18.20. 

	

Slaughter bulls: yield 	Sheep (per 16) 

	

grade 1-2. 1.200-2,050 lbs . 	Feeder lambs40-60 lbs.. 

	

.43-.52. Slaughter cows: 	78-.82, Light lambs .  60-90 

lbs, .75-.80: Fat Iambs: 90- 
120 lbs., .65-.75. 

Ems: 
Stocker. .40-.45; Thin. .30-
.35; F,I1, 35-.40. 

Bucks, 
Thin, NT Fat, 33-.40. 

Barbados (per bead) 
Lambs: 535.540. Ewes: 520- 
$35. Bucks:535-560. 

Goats (per bead) 
Kids: 20-35 lbs., 520-530; 

35-55 lbs. 530-540; 55-75 
lbs.550-570. Yearlings: 75- 
'20 lbs., $75-5100. 

Nannies (per head) 
Stocker, 550-575; Milk Type, 
560-575, Slaughter Thin $25-
530, Fat, $40-560. 

Ashes (per head) 
120 lbs.up 

Breedcm5100-5120; 
Slaughters. 575-5120. 

Boer Goats (per head) 
1/2 Nanny. 560-$75; 3/4 

Nanny, 580-5165; Full Nanny, 
5175-5225. 

Boer Goats (per heed) 
12 Billy, NT, 3/4 Billy. NT, 
Full Billy, 5165-5260. 

MMH FAMILY HEALTH CLINIC 
509 NORTH MAPLE 

MUENSTER, TEXAS 76252 
(940) 759-2226 

WELCOMING NEW PATIENTS 

EDD G. AMINCULA, M.D., F.A.C.P. 
BOARD CERTIFIED 

RNAL MEDICINE 

MELISSA TRUBENBACH, FNP-C 
BOARD CERTIFIED 

FAMILY NURSE PRACTITIONER 

YVONNE AMBROSE, FNP-C 
	

MARY K. ENDRES, FNP-C 
BOARD CERTIFIED 
	

BOARD CERTIFIED 

FAMILY NURSE PRACTITIONER 
	

FAMILY NURSE PRACTITIONE R  

PROVIDING QUALITY HEALTH CARE To PATIENTS OF ALL AGES 

HOURS: 	MONDAY - FRIDAY 	9AM - 5PM 
SATURDAY 	 9AM - 12Noon 

MEDICARE, MEDICAID, AND MOST INSURANCES ACCEPTED 

AUDREY C. MORRILL, M D. 
BOARD CERTIFIED 

FAMILY PRACTICE 
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Farm & Ranch Livestock Assistance Program covers 161 counties 
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\ griculture Commissioner 
, an Combs has noted that 
Texas agricultural industry 

• m the midst of its third 
, ught in four years and is 
ering a crisis situation as 

, st farmers and ranchers 
e not recovered from the 

nights of 1996 and 1998. 
Many areas of the state 
ve not received significant 
infall since last summer," 
mbs said. "1999 has ended 
one of the driest years on 

cord. And weather forecasts 
II for dry conditions to 
itinue into the spring." 
Livestock producers have 
en hardest hit by the 
ought. Stock tanks are 
ying up in many counties, 
d 71 percent of the states 
nges and pastures are in 
or to very poor condition. 
Some ranchers are hauling 

`ter or moving livestock to 
ler pastures,' Combs said. 
ne  rancher reported having 
pay $7 a head per month to 
`ter his cattle." 
current cattle prices are up 
)m last year, but Texas 
others may lose out if they 
ye to liquidate herds because 
lack of water, poor forage 
editions and high hay prices. 
Winter wheat, which is a 
ajor winter forage crop for 
ttle, has suffered significant 
:ses. Because of drought 
editions, Texas producers 
ve planted 5.8 million acres, 
wn 6 percent from last year. 
nety-one percent of the 
ite's winter wheat crop is in 
r to very poor condition. 
If dry conditions continue 
rough the spring, crop 
oducers face a serious 
cation. 
'The dry winter is taking 
Any of our farmers into a 
ring planting season with no 
rface soil moisture and no 
bsurface soil moisture," 
.mbs said. "We are six weeks 
iay from planting corn in 

South Texas, and soil moisture 
is needed. If it doesn't start 
raining, many areas of the 
state may not see any spring 
planting. 

The Texas Department of 
Agriculture is taking action to 
provide relief with drought 
information assistance packets: 
one version for producers and 
one version for local officials 
who need to apply for 
emergency relief, Combs said. 

TDA has sent the packets to 
county judges, county 
extension agents and local 
Farm Service Agency and 
Texas Farm Bureau offices. 
Farmers and ranchers may 
receive a copy of the producer 
information package by calling 
the agency's State Drought 
Coordinator Bill Breese at 512-
463-7517. 

In addition, Combs said she 
is notifying state and federal 
lawmakers about the growing 
crisis. 

"We have written our state 
legislators and the Texas 
congressional delegation to 
make them aware of the 
situation in our state. I have 
also urged our federal 
lawmakers to ensure federal 
drought assistance be provided 
in a timely manner. 

"Drought aid voted by 
Congress in the fall of 1998 did 
not reach many producers until 
June 1999. For Texas 

Texas Farm Bureau 
President Bob Stallman was 
elected president of the 
American Farm Bureau 
Federation at the 
organization's 81st annual 
meeting in Houston last week. 
Stallman, a Colorado County 
rice farmer, served as Texas 
Farm Bureau president since 
1993. 
Stallman, 47, succeeds Dean 
Kleckner, of Iowa, who had 
served as AFBF president since 
1986. 

producers, that was too late, 
Combs said. "I will continue to 
press the U.S. Department of 
Agriculture and the Farm 
Service Agency to act quickly." 

Currently, 75 Texas counties 
have been declared disasters 
due to drought and are eligible 
for disaster assistance. An 
additional 13 counties are in 
Washington awaiting approval. 

TDA also has available 
disaster relief loans through 
the Texas Agricultural Finance 
Authority's Linked Deposit 
Program, which the 
Legislature granted additional 
lending authority to during last 
year's session. 

Combs said TDA will 
continue to work on providing 
information and assistance on 
disaster relief as the dry spell 
continues. 

"Unfortunately, drought is 
inevitable in Texas. Our state 
has experienced serious 
drought in various regions for 
each decade of the last 
century," she said. "And it 
appears that the 21st century 
will be no different. 

"If we don't get rain, we have 
a potentially devastating 
situation shaping up in Texas 
agriculture. The Texas 
Department of Agriculture will 
be on the frontlines working 
with producers during these 
tough times," Combs said. 

"I will miss the wonderful 
farmers and ranchers of Texas. 
All the Farm Bureau members 
in Texas have been very 
supportive," Stallman said. "I 
look forward to working for and 
with all the farmers and 
ranchers of America as we 
work together for agriculture. " 

Stallman, who becomes the 
national organization's 11th 
president, has served on the 
AFBF board of directors since 
1994. 

In 1996, Stallman was 
appointed by Texas Governor 
George W. Bush to the 
Citizen's Committee on 
Property Tax Relief. Also, in 
1996 he was appointed by then 
House Agriculture Committee 
Chairman Pat Roberts to the 
Commission on 21st Century 
Production Agriculture, a panel 
that is conducting extensive 
hearings on future farm policy 
alternatives. 

Stallman resigned as 
president of Texas Farm 
Bureau upon his election. TFB 
Vice-President Donald Patman 
of Waxahachie, a grain and 
cotton farmer, will become 
president of the state's largest 
farm organization. 

Agriculture Commissioner 
Susan Combs announced 
recently that 61 additional 
Texas counties have been 
approved by the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture 
Farm Service Agency for the 
Livestock Assistance Program 
for a total of 161 counties. 

LAP, administrated by FSA, 

COUNTY BREEDERS 
FEATURED  

Fuhrmann Bros. Limousin at 
Lindsay have two of their bulls 
featured on the cover of the U.S. and 
Canada International Limousin 
Genetic Evaluation book (sire 
summary) for 2000. Our congrat-
ulations to these local breeders. 

MARKETING CLUB 
...meets the second and fourth 

Tuesday of the month. The next 
session will be Tuesday, January 
25, at 7:00 P.M. at the Farm 
Bureau Building on Hwy. 82, in 
Gainesville. Topics covered 
include market analysis, using 
technicals, forward contracts, and 
hedging with futures & options. 

WHEAT 
Texas wheat producers have 

seeded 5.8 million acres for the 
2000 winter wheat crop, down 
6 percent from last year, and 5 
percent less than 1998. 

Nationally, U.S. seedings of 
winter wheat for 2000 totaled 
42.9 million acres, down 1 
percent from the 1999 level. 
This is the lowest wheat 
seeding since 1972. 

CROP PRODUCTION 
Most spring-planted crops 

matured before the late 
summer-fall drought developed 
and escaped serious loss, 
according to final estimates of 
1999 spring-planted crops 
released by the Texas 
Agricultural Statistics Service. 

The 1999 Texas Upland 
cotton crop totaled 5.05 
million bales, 40 percent more 
than 1998. An estimated 5.1 
million acres were harvested, 
55 percent more than in 1998, 
when drought resulted in 
greater than normal 
abandonment. Planted acreage 
totaled 6.15 million acres and 
acreaged 475 pounds per acre. 

Corn production was 
estimated at 228.3 million 
bushels, up 23 percent from 
1998. Statewide yield was 
estimated at 129 bushels per 
acre, harvested acreage was 
estimated at 1.77 million acres. 

Texas peanut production 
was estimated at 924 million 
pounds. Statewide yield, at a 
record 3,300 pounds per acre, 
was 560 pounds above 1998. 

Sorghum production was 
estimated at 104.1 million 
hundredweight (cwt), 76 
percent above last year.  

provides direct payments to 
eligible livestock producers in 
approved counties that suffered 
grazing losses due to natural 
disasters during 1999. 
Nationwide, $200 million has 
been allocated for livestock 
producers for weather-related 
losses as part of the $8.7 billion 
farm assistance package 

CORN & GRAIN SORGHUM  
MEETINGS 

Dr. Cloyce Coffman, Extension 
agronomist at Texas A&M will 
present a program on the issue of 
GE, Conservation Tillage of Grain 
Sorghum During Drought, and 
Cultural Practices at the two 
meeting on Thursday, February 10, 
2000. The meetings will be at 8:00 
A.M. at W.B. Hudspeth at Era, or 
11:00 A.M. at the Cooke county 
Electric Co-Op in Muenster. 2 
CEU's will be offered to those 
producers attending toward 
recertification of TDA pesticide 
licenses'. 

Harvested acreage was 
estimated at 2.95 million acres, 
yielding 3,528 pounds per acre. 

The 1999 Texas soybean 
crop was estimated at 10.3 
million bushels. Harvested 
acreage was estimated at 380 
thousand acres, and yield was 
estimated at 27 bushels per 
acre. 

Production of all hay was 
estimated at 13.1 million tons, 
91 percent more than in 1998. 
Acreage was up 37 percent 
from last year  

passed in October. An extra 
$10 million in funding was 
approved in H.R. 3194, which 
provides $576 million in 
additional emergency funding. 

For drought-related losses, 
LAP benefits are available in 
approved counties where 
precipitation was 40 percent or 
more below normal for at least 
four months and where there 
was at least a 40 percent loss of 
available grazing during a 90-
day period due to drought. 

Eligible producers must have 
suffered a 40 percent or greater 
loss of grazing for a 90-day 
period during 1999. Eligible 
livestock include beef and dairy 
cattle; buffalo of beefalo when 
maintained on the same basis 
as beef cattle; sheep; goats; 
swine; and equine animals 
used commercially for human 
food or kept for the production 
of food or fiber on the owner's 
farm or ranch. 

Approved counties include 
Cooke, 	Grayson, 	and 
Montague. 	For 	more 
information, contact your local 
USDA-FSA. 

Avoid back 
injuries 
Back injuries are the most 

common among farmers. To 
avoid injury to the back, follow 
these safety guidelines. 

When lifting a heavy object, 
avoid bending at the waist. 
Bend at the knees, keeping 
your back straight. This forces 
your arms and legs to do the 
lifting. 

• Do not twist your waist 
when lifting. 

• Pick up only what you can't 
push or pull. 

• Face what you are lifting. 
• When lifting lighter items, 

raise one leg backward when 
bending over to pick up the 
item . 

,lommissioner Combs: 'Texas agriculture 
xperiencing third drought in four years" 

Beware of little expenses; 
small leak will sink a 

real ship. 

Texan elected Farm 
Bureau president 

(County Agent's Report 
by  Craig Rosenbaum 

NOTICE 
Nith the ponds cleaned out & dry & 
tfter our 'big' rain, you may want to 
eplenish your stock ponds. We have 
ninnows, largemouth bass, crappie, 
'atfish, bluegills & sunfish. 

Contact Danny at 759-2546. 

JAMES DUNHAM 
BENEFIT 

RANCH RODEO 
AUSTIN INDOOR ARENA 

MUENSTER, TX 
(From Hwy 82 turn N. on Main St. (at red light) go 1.7 miles-arena is on the left.) 

Sat. Jan. 29 7:00 - rodeo and auction 

Sun. Jan. 30 2:00 - rodeo, auction, & raffle 
drawing for Browning A-Bolt II Medallion w/scope & case 

*Team roping 	*Double mugging 
*Team sorting 	*Wild cow milking 

*Team branding 
$200.00 4 - man team entry fee 

**Concessions and raffle tickets available** 
****Donations areatly appreciated****  

Adults $5.00 Children 12 & under $2.50 Children under 2 free 

*For more info. contact Jerry or Joye Harrell 940-665-7502 
**Stephen Geray 940-668-0366 or leave message 



OSCAR MEYER REG. BUN LENGTH & LITE 

Weiner's 
LOUIS RICH - VARIETY PACK 

Lunchmeat 
OSCAR MEYER 

Lunchables 

$1 29 
1 LB 	• 

1 59 
12 OZ 

10.8 OZ-13202 $ 1 
49 

• BUTTERFINGER BB'S • 
• BUNCH A CRUNCH • 

• BABTRUTH • 
• BUTTERFINGER • CRUNCI 

IND. 01 NONA' 

Pepcid 
AC 

Frozen & Dairy 
CRINKLE CUT, COUNTRY STYLE 	 ASSORTED 

Ore Ida Fries ,al Jepo's 
24-32 OZ. 	 Pizza 

7.2-8.102. 

C 
„ash,  SHEDD'S SPREAD 

16 OZ. SQUEEZE, 
2.8 OZ. MINI OR 16 OZ. 
REG. OR CHURN STYLE 

Country 
Crock 

99c 

DINNER OR GOLDEN 

1 99  cr 

RED BARON 

Pizza 
EACH 

2$A 
FOR  my 

ASSORTED 

Blue Bell 
Ice Cream 

HALF GALLON 

369 
ASST. TROPICANA 

Tnat.. PURE PREMIUM 

, 4„ Orange 
Juice 

64 OZ. 

Buffalo Wings 
5 LB NET NEW BAR S BONELESS 

Whole Hams 
BAP S BONELESS RALF 

2$ 
FOR  5 
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FISCHER'S 

Hot 

Links 

$2?2 $21L 
FISCHER'S 

MARKET CUT 

Salami 

$1 39 
,f4it% 

Catfish 

Fillets 

S'cozerldtea L'otaz4, Sftece.:46, 

Hams 	

$ 	 EACH 	

6 $ 49  	 EACH 

PILGRIM'S PRIDE 30 OL BAP BE EWE OR 32 02 	

499 

	 LB $ 1 49  

S LB 690  

$ 
48 OZ

1 29 
 

80Z 81$1 
00 

590  
20 CT 160Z 790  

11 5 02 
$119  

12 OZ. SHURFINE 

American Single, 

REGULAR OR LIGHT 	FOR 

SELECT GROUP 

Post 
TOWN TALK 
	Cereal 

13 02 COCOA PEE& 

13 OZ FRUITY PEON' 5 
12 02 GRAPENUT 

24 02 GRAPES' 5 

BEEF, CHICKEN OR TURKEY 20 OZ RA15,1 BF ‘I 

OIL/WATER PACKED CHICKEN OF THE SEA 	Swanson 	,.1,,, 

Chunk Light Tuna Pot Pies ` 

1.N  

17Z4L. e'Q/ 
7 02 

FOR 	6 OL 	 FOR O' "iP 

2$ 	(.•:"taj''';,k: ....s  .544-,, 

 2$  1  c IN  i  8  
0  ‘.- 	IP' 

 • 

iff. L  _ 1 
'T  AN   

REGULAR OR MINIATURE 

Shurfine 	Flake 
Marshmallows Coconu: 

9' 
 

1 0- 10 .5 

	9149c 

SHURFINE 

Corn 
Syrup 
32 OZ. 

99° 

10 LB. BAG 
FRYER 

Leg 
Quarter 

FISCHER'S 

Fully Cooked 

Sausage 

FISCHER'S 1/2 & 1/2 

Smoked 

Sausage 

$239  LB 

FISCHER'S 

	

Rib-I Steaks 	Cube Steak 

	

95 	$0,639 	$.1 99  Flounder  $ 79 

	

4 LB 	 LB 	•  LB 	Fillets 	LB 

LAY SO OR WAVY LAPS® 

Potato  Lay 
Chips 

REG. 52.99 

19  rigtnnl 

SHURSAVING 

Flour 
SHURSAVING 

Corn Oil or Salad Oil 
SHURSAVING 

Tomato Sauce 

HiDri Towels 
PARTYTIME VALUE BUY 

Big Drink Cup 
WELCH "S 

Juice Makers (Apple Only)... 

ASSORTED 

Rotel 
Tomatoes 

69' 
PEPSI 
COLA 

79e Wheat Bread 	
YOUR CHOICE 

$1 79 

Kraft Velveeta 
$ 

1111 
Es 

32 OZ. 

NI 

2$ 

SHURSAVING WHITE 

6 ROLL PIG.  

Bath 
Tissue 

3 BAR IRISH SPRING 

Bath 
Soap 

5 02 

$ 79 

ASSORTED ALPO 

Cat 
Food A' 

5.5 OZ. 

ASST. BETTY CROCKER/ 
GOLD MEDAL 

Cookie 
Mix 
17.5 OZ. 

3 2$ 
FOR 

AUNT JEMIM:: REGULAR, 
BUTTERMILK OR COMPLETE 

Pancake 
Mix 

32 02 

$1 49 

REG., LED OR BUTTER LITE 

Aunt Jemima 
Syrup 

24 02.  

$239 
Sugar Cookie 

Cochiatl 
PIANUIS j 

• .■ 

yi (4,7  

REG/UNSALTED DRY ROASTED 
OR REG. COCKTAIL 

Planter's 
Peanuts 

12 OZ 

$2 19  

ASSORTED 

Smack 
Ramen 

3 OZ.  

FOR 

BETTY CROCKER POP SECRET 

Microwave 
Popcorn 

3 PK. 

Z$3 

ASSORTED 	rt 

a11  :14- Nestle  

1."  

REGULAR SIZE 

3$  

FOR 

HAMBURGER DILL OR 
BREAD & BUTTER 

Vlasic 
Stackers 

24 OZ . 

$719 
Candy 

Farm Fresh Produce 
NEW CROP 	

N.EW CROP 

Hass 	°Limes 
Avocados Lemons 

3$1 10$ 
FOR 	FOR 

51.69 DOLE CLASSIC 	 BUY ONE 
GET ONE 

Iceberg Salad 	I LB MG FREE 
SPICY 

Jalapeno Peppers 	LB 69' 	Roil-On 
WASHINGTON EXTRA FANCY RED DELICIOUS 

Apples 	 . 69' 
GREEN GIANT MINI PEELED 

Carrots 

Ban 

I LB. MG 99e 
199 

PEPPER $ 39 
 LIMIT 2 

12 PACK 
12 OZ COLA 

2 PEPSI  $ 
FOR 

PePal  $ 599  
__--_Al_ 

Buy 1 Get 1 Free 

Tavist-D 
Decongestant 

Chinet Paper 
Plates 

$  99 
40 CT. 9" 

EACH 

15 CT. ILA INCH CHINET REG . 

OR COMPARTMENT PLATE OR 

Chinet Paper 
Platters 

$  199 
12 CT. 10 INCH 

Health and Beauty 

Alka-Seltzer 
Plus 

$299 $319 

Since 1927 
We Wouldn't be 72 Without You! SENIOR CITIZENS: No Amount of Purchase 

Necessary On Limited Sale Items! 
NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR PICTORIAL OR TYPOGRAPHICAL ERRORS.  

DD R 1111JDnAD  
;Tischer's  rat arket 

SINCE 1927 
304 North Main, Muenster, TX 	1 (800) 259-7248 or 759-4211 

DOUBLE COUPONS EVERY DAY 

QUANTITY RIGHTS 
RESERVED 

ellIFFFILIATED 
FOODS INC 
of Amarillo 

ALL ITEMS NOT 
AVAILABLE AT ALL 
AFFILIATED STORES 

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
JANUARY 24 • 30, 2000 
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