
Muenster Lake Dedication Ceremony 

The Muenster Water District hosted a dedication of Muenster Lake Pat Stelzer, Bob Bauer, Celine Dittfurth, Gene Walter, Estes, and 
Wednesday morning. The event was moved to Muenster ISD after Wayne Grewing. Watch next week's Muenster Enterprise for 
heavy rains dampened original on-site ceremonies. Pictured are more on the dedication. 
Board members with Senatur Craig Estes. From left - Milton Knauf, 	 Janie Hartman photo 

Lindsay graduates, including Jenny Schroeder and Kaileigh Hess, 
took time for pictures before graduation ceremonies began. 

Scott Wood photo 
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Sr. Roberta Hesse named SHCS Distinguished Alumni 
The second annual presen-

tation of the Distinguished 
Alumni award was held dur-
ing Sacred Heart Catholic 
High School's graduation cer-
emony on May 18. With a cer-
tificate from the National 
Catholic Educational Associa-
tion, this award goes to some-
one who exemplifies the 
qualities of Catholic educa-
tion and has rendered distin-
guished service to the Catho-
lic Church, explained Princi-
pal Chad Riley as he an-
nounced the award. 

"I am honored to present 
the 2007 Distinguished 
Alumni award to Sister 
Roberta Hesse," he said. in 
addition to the dedication of 
her life to service as a Sister 
of St. Mary of Namur, Sister 
Roberta was an administra-
tor at Our Lady of Victory 
Academy and has dedicated 
30 years of her life to evange-
lization and nursing in the 
Republic of Congo, Rwanda. 
Cameroon, and Tanzania, all 
on the continent of Africa. 
And as an example of her 
dedication to the ministry of 
Catholic education, after her 

It was a time of celebration 
for the Muenster ISD Class of 
2007 on Friday, May 25 as the 
36 seniors took part in the 7 
p.m. commencement exercise. 
The event was held in the 
Muenster Hornet gymnasium. 

Members of the Muenster 
High Class of 2007 are: Mat-
thew Anthony Abney, Mary 
Lynn Ater, David Matthew 
Beaver, Casey Dawn Bewley, 
Don Lee Caswell, Catherine 
Melissa Cox, Angelica DelRio, 
Brad Donald Endres, Chad Ri-
chard Endres, Sandra Michelle 
Endres, Michael Dale Faries, 
Megan Elizabeth Felderhoff. 
Neal Micah Flusche, Amber 
Joy Fuhrmann, Clayton Cole 
Harrison, Jessika Franziska 
Hartman, William Joseph 
Haverkamp, Jr., Meredith 
Emily Hennigan, Christopher 
David Holder, James Dean 
Janota, Evan Joseph Koesler, 
Jordan Nicole Ledbetter, Jef-
frey William McLaughlin, 
Elizabeth G. Orsburn, Kayla 
Dayne Otto, Joshua Tyler 
Patrick, Jayna Raley Rohmer, 
Kalyn Jenee Rohmer, Zachary 
Richard Swirczynski, Michael 
Thomas Valliere, Jose Yovani 
Velasquez, Bret Homsley 
Walterscheid, Collin Joseph 
Walterscheid, Jessica Marie 
Walterscheid, Britney LaRae 
Wann, Krystal Ann Wolf. 

The graduates processed in 
as Justin Bell played "Pomp 
and Circumstance". Micah 
Flusche gave the invocation. 

Salutatorian Krystal Wolf 
spoke of how far away their 
graduation day seemed when 
they entered kindergarten in 
1994 and how far off it even 
seemed on Jan. 1, 2007. "Today 
is the day that we never 

By Janet Felderhoff 
At the regular meeting held 

Tuesday, May 29, Cooke 
County Commissioners Court 
appointed a Steering Com- 
mittee to look at the cost of 
renovations or requirements 
that would be put on the 
County by the Juvenile Board 
should it decide to make use 
of the old jail facility. 

Commissioners Gary Hol-
lowell and Virgil Hess serve 
on the Tri-County Depart-
ment of Juvenile Services 
Board in Sherman. Hollowell 
told the Court, "We have an 
opportunity possibly to make 
some renovations to our old 
jail and be able to house ju-
veniles from the area and 
around the State." 

Appointed to the Steering 
Committee were Bill Briscoe, 
Jim Farquhar, Rick Kerr, and 
Commissioner Hollowell. 

"Right now we will just be 
looking at cost and then we 
will come back to Commis-
sioners Court to see if the in-
come offsets the coat of reno-
vation," said Hollowell. 
"There is a substantial in-
come out there very possibly. 
There is a small window of  

parents died. she became the 
caregiver of her siblings and 
arranged for them to attend 
a Catholic school." 

Because of her current 
work as a missionary in Tan-
zania, Sr. Roberta could not 
attend the graduation. Ac- 

thought we would see," she re-
marked. "We have been expe-
riencing 'ends' all year long, the 
ends of quarters, the ends of 
semesters, the ends of sports 
seasons, ...But until now, noth-
ing was really final. Today is 
the last end that we will expe-
rience together." 

Krystal recalled some of 
their shared experiences on 
their educational journey to 
become the young adults they 
are today, ready to begin their 
futures. She said that lessons 

they learned include that with-
out enthusiasm, you can't do 
anything or make progress. 

"We have been taught not to 
fight, but have figured out that 
arguing is not always a bad 
thing," said 'Crystal. "It makes 
friendships stronger once you 

opportunity to address this." 
Commissioner Hess got ap-

proval to advertise for sealed 
bids for the construction of 
the Precinct #4 County main-
tenance facility. 

June 30 was declared as 
Booker T. Washington 
Alumni Association's Re-
union Day in Cooke County. 
In 1886 it was opened as a 
school in Gainesville for col-
ored students. In 1896 it had 
four graduates, its first. In 
1967, the school was officially 
abolished. The school's 
Alumni Association is reach-
ing out to graduates and 
hopes to hold a reunion every 
two years beginning June 30 
this year. 

In other business, Commis-
sioners Court: 

• Authorized Public Power 
Pool to intervene for Cooke 
County in the TXU acquisi-
tion. This is to ensure that 
rates don't go up when Encore 
takes over. 

• Authorized County Trea-
surer Judy Hunter and her 
assistant Patty Brennan as 
the County's representatives 
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cepting the award in her 
place were her siblings Chris 
Sanders, Jane Myrick, 
Caroline Neu, and Bernard 
Hesse. 

Sr. Roberta had her sister 
Chris relay her comments 
about receiving the ,ward. 

make up, just as broken bones 
become stronger once they 
have healed. ...These disagree-
ments have also taught us how 
to forgive... one of the MUSTS 
in life. 

"Never be afraid to be the 
person that you truly are and 
always do what you believe is 
right." She also challenged 
them to keep their spirits up, 
to have good times, and to step 
out of the box and challenge 
themselves. She shared a quote 
from Eleanor Roosevelt, The 

future belongs to those who 
believe in the beauty of their 
dreams." 

Valedictorian Megan Felder-
hoff said that none of them 
would be here today without 
the help and support of par-
ents, families, friends, teach-
ers, coaches, and administra-
tors. She said that the class did 
not have to fear the future, 
nothing would hold them back. 
"We will not rely on fate; we are 
going to be creating our own 
destinies! I am confident that 
every single person in this class 
has the potential to achieve 
greatness," she commented. 

Megan said that greatness 
means different things to dif-
ferent people whether it be 
something created, a feat ac-
complished, or some recogni-
tion such as winning an Oscar. 
She said, "lb most of us how-
ever, greatness is right now! 
Greatness is not the aspire- 

By Janet Felderhoff 
Commencement ceremo-

nies were held Friday, May 25 
for Lindsay High School's 
Class of 2007. 

Graduates were Cindy 
Valeria Alcala, Jordan Lee 
Alexander, Brittany Lynn 
Anderle, Sanaa Anwar, Jil-
lian Leigh Bezner, Meredith 
Kathryn Bezner, Sabrina 
Rose Bezner, Kodie Nichole 
Buck, Justin Tyler Callier, 
Michael Lee Conaway, Allison 
Paige Copeland, Christopher 
William Dieter, Travis John 
Endres, Samuel Denton 
Faulkner, Bernhard Rudolf 
Gabriel, Marc Aaron Hacker, 

She said, 'We, the family of 
Sister Roberta, and the Sis-
ters of St. Mary of Namur, are 
honored to accept this award 
for Sister Roberta. Her 
Catholic education here at 
Sacred Heart has been a sig-
nificant factor in her misso i 

tions of a single person. Great-
ness is so much more than that. 
It is built on a foundation ce-
mented with relationships and 
experiences." 

Megan noted that Isaac 
Newton said that the only rea-
son that he could see farther 
than others is because he stood 
on the shoulders of giants. She 
added that the only reason that 
any of them have the potential 
to be great is that they have 
stood and leaned on each 
other's shoulder ,  "We have 

been there for each other 
through our trials and 
tribulations...our successes 
and failures," she said. Even 
though they are going their 
separate ways, Megan said 
that they're relationships 
shou:d not be forgotten, but be-
come stronger. 

"We are all connected 
through our actions and expe-
riences, and it's these experi-
ences that bind us in some way 
to every individual around us. 
And I challenge every single 
member of this class to cher-
ish and use these experiences 
to comfort you in the years 
ahead." 

Principal Curtis Eldridge 
introduced the guest speaker, 
LuAnna Stephens, PhD. She is 
director for Superintendents' 
Program, Angelo State Univer-
sity, and Texas Education 
Agency advisor. Stephens cap-
tured the attention of the au- 

Julie Kristine Hanson, Emily 
Catherine Haverkamp, Levi 
Joseph Hermes, Amanda 
Marie Hess, Jeffrey Scott 
Hess, Kaileigh Rose Hess, 
John Paul Jones, Joshua 
Matthew Jones, Nichole 
Michelle Krebs, Rebecca 
Laine Martinez, Madison 
Ann Montgomery, Autumn 
Rene Murrill, Dustin William 
Neu, Elizabeth Rae Neu, Me-
lissa Dawn Neu, Amy Leigh 
Nortman, Heather LeeAnn 
Odell, Joseph John Otto, 
Chandni Raj Patel, Traci 
Michelle Redder, Karissa 
Michelle Reiter, Jocelyn 
Sanchez, Brian William 

ary work in Africa - in Congo 
and Rwanda, in Cameroon, 
and now in Tanzania. And I 
know she would want us to 
thank you and all the parish-
ioners of Sacred Heart for the 
many contributions you have 
made for the missions. She 

thence with her humorous re-
marks. She said that everyone 
has dreams, goals, and advice, 
but she didn't talk about that 
because she knew the gradu-
ates were thinking more about 
what they had planned later 
that evening. 

Stephens read a letter from 
a girl named Jodie on her first 
day of school. The reason she 
was going to school was to build 
a future. "This school is a good 
school," she noted, "Teachers 
work hard to build your fu-
ture." She asked the teachers 
and Board to stand, and asked 
the graduates to thank them 
because if they didn't love the 
students, they wouldn't be 
there. 

"You are in charge of your 
own discipline now," Stephens 
told the graduates. "Don't for-
get where you came from. Pro-
tect your good name. Your fain-
tly gave you that name," she 
said. 

In closing, Stephens in-
structed the graduates, "What-
ever you deside to do, do it with 
your whole heart. Always be 
kind to people who are differ-
ent. Make people around you 
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Sandmann, Jennifer Maria 
Schroeder, Jeffrey Kenneth 
Shannon, Kristin Leigh 
Sharp, Rachael Brianne 
Skinner, Victoria Lynn Vogel, 
Laura Kay Willard, Benjamin 
Cletus Wyrick, Johnathan 
William Zimmerer, Laura 
Kathryn Zimmerer, and 
Rachel Elaine Zimmerer. 

Autumn Murrill, class vice-
president, greeted guests. 

Salutatorian Chandni Pa-
tel was introduced by Craig 
Hertel. 

Chandni noted that the last 
four years had been full of 
ends. Such as ends of quar-
ters and semesters, ends of  

will be happy to receive this 
award when she returns. to 
Texas toward the end ofJuly. 

Born Irma Hesse, Sr. Rob- 
" 

erta attended school in Musa-
ster through the 10th grade. 
She then entered the convent 
in the order of St. Mary of 
Namur in Fort Worth. She 
entered in 1953 and made her 
final vows in 1961. 

Deceased 
veterans 
honored 

Muenster Veterans of For-
eign Wars Post 6205 and its 
Ladies Auxiliary remembered 
its deceased veterans on Sun-
day, May 27. The Memorial 
Day tributes began with the 
deceased members of the Post 
being remembered at the 8 
a.m. Mass. 

Liturgical readings were 
given by Auxiliary President 
Frances Bayer, with Prayers 
of the Faithful being read by 
Auxiliary Conductress Linda 
Knabe. Offertory gifts were 
presented by Post Com-
mander Doug Martin and Vet-
eran James Hess. 

The services continued af-
ter Mass when the Post Color 
Guard, Auxiliary Color 
Guard, Auxiliary officers, Fa-
ther Ken Robinson, and chil-
dren led the procession to Sa-
cred Heart Cemetery where 
Auxiliary Chaplain Rose 
Marie Sicking placed a floral 
tribute and Fr. Ken led the 
group in prayer in memory of 
all the deceased of the Parish. 

The procession then pro-
ceeded to the flag-draped Vet-
erans Plot where Auxiliary 
President Frances Bayer and 
Auxiliary Junior Vice Presi-
dent Sandra Hennigan placed 
a memorial and buddy poppy 
wreath respectively at the 
Veterans Monument. The chil-
dren placed red carnations on 
each soldier's grave. 

Christy Hesse sang 
"America, the Beautiful" as 
the group marched off the 
plot. Fr. Ken offered prayers 
for all deceased veterans, 
along with thanksgiving and 
petition of safety for all those 
currently in the service of 
their country. 

Commander Martin then 
gave the Memorial address, 
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sports seasons and school 
years. "But until now, noth-
ing was really final," she said. 
"There was always another 
semester, another season, or 
another school year after an 
all-too-brief summer. 

"Now it is different. Tbday's 
graduation ceremony marks 
the end of our high school ca-
reers." 

After touching on a few 
memories through the years, 
Chandni remarked on the 
success of the class. "We've 
had several State champion 
UIL academic teams, break 
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County considers 
new use of old jail 

Muenster 
High seniors 

Britney 
Wann, 
Jessica 

Walterscheid, 
and Megan 
Felderhoff 
view items 

before 
graduation 
ceremonies 
Friday night 

that the 
Class of '07 

put in a 
"time 

capsule" 
while in 

elementary 
school. 
Janie 

Hartman 
photo 

MISD grads told to do whatever they do with their whole heart 

Class of 49 Lindsay seniors embark on future 
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	OBITUARY  
Dorothy Bayer 

1943-2007 

feel good." She then had the 
parents of the graduates stand 
for applause. 

Counselor Kristi Schneider 
presented scholarships to the 
graduates, including: 

Casey Bewley - NCTC Mary 
Josephine Cox (MJC) Memo-
rial; 

Melissa Cox - NCTC Mabel 
and Leo Scott Dual Credit, 
Muenster Kiwanis Club, Lead 
America, The Law Offices of 
Jim A. Robertson, The Don't 
Mess With Texas, Carl and 
MaryLee Alford, 'Naas Chris-
tian University Honor, 
Provost's Baylor; 

Brad Endres - Muenster 
Memorial Hospital David 
Bright Memorial, Nortex Foun-
dation for Rural Education and 
Development, Cooke County 
Co-op, 'Naas Tech University 
Presidential Endowed; 

Chad Endres - Muenster 
High School Principal's, Muen-
ster State Bank, O.A. Daniel 
Computer Engineering at Mid-
western State University; 

Sandy Endres - NCTC MJC 
Memorial, NCTC Norman and 
Evelyn Luke, Muenster Jay-
cees; 

Megan Felderhoff - NCTC 
Leo and Mabel Scott Dual 
Credit, Hilsabeck Foundation, 
Muenster High School Na-
tional Honor Society, Dallas 
Scottish Rite, Paul Piggot, 
Texas Woman's University 
Presidential Valedictorian; 

MEMORIAL 
including some of the hiihory 
which began as Decoration 
Day after the Civil War. 
People remembered the fallen 
by decorating each gravesite 
with a flag. Over the years, it 
evolved into Memorial Day. 
Commander Martin stated, 
"It is up to us, the living, to 
uphold their legacy with re-
spect, reverence, and heartfelt 
gratitude. All too often, we as 
Americans forget the respon-
sibility we have to keep the 
memory of those brave men 
and women alive... Because of 
them, America remains truly 
the home of the free and the 
land of the brave." 

Christy Hesse sang "God 
Bless America," followed by 
the playing of TAPS by Ron-
nie and Tina Weinzzipfel as a 
final salute to the valiant men 
and women who gave their 
lives in defense of our coun-
try 

Post Color Guard members 
were Don Eckart, James 

65 YEARS AGO 
May 29, 1942 

Sacred Heart School gradu- 
ates include: Wilfred Bindel, 
Thomas Felderhoff, Herbert 
Fette, Alvin Hartman, Alfons 
Koester, Norbert Mages, Tho- 
mas Otto, Paul Sicking, 
George Swirczynski, Denis 
Walterscheid, Herbert Yos- 
ten, Dorothy Eberhart, Mar- 
gie Endres, LaRue Felder- 
hoff, Tony Mae Friske, 
Bernice 	and 	Bertha 
Haverkamp, Florence 
Haverkamp, Mary Nel 
Hennigan, Theresa Mae Pels 
LaVerne Starke, Helen 
Walterscheid, Laura Wilde 

Micah Flusche - TMSCA Top 
Gun Award, Gene H. Fuhrman 
through Nortex, Texas Tech 
Honors Endowed; 

Amber Fuhrmann - 4th De-
gree Knights of Columbus Lee 
WolfAssembly Patriotism, Fort 
Worth Livestock Show and Ro-
deo Calf Scramble, Cameron 
University Out of State Tuition 
Waiver; 

Cole Harrison -ACAD Com-
petitiveness Grant, Texas Thch 
Residential Grant, United 
States Federal Grant; 

William Haverkamp - Muen-
ster High School Principal's; 

Meredith Hennigan - 
Elmcreek Manor Luxury Re-
sort Scholarship Award for ex-
cellence in service, loyalty, and 
professionalism; NCTC David 
and LouAnn Spaeth; Sacred 
Heart Parish Pastor's Service; 
University of North Texas 
Norman and Evelyn Luke re-
newable for four years; 

Evan Koester - Muenster 
Memorial Hospital Auxiliary, 
Muenster Knights of Colum-
bus, Texas Tech University 
Scholar Award; 

Jordan Ledbetter - The 
Maggie Fisher/Stephanie 
Huchton Memorial, Church 
Staff Dependent, Prichard, 
Edmond and Helen Packwood; 

Elizabeth Orsburn - Cooke 
County Retired Teachers 
Scholarship with NCTC, 
NASCOGA Federal Credit 
Union; 
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Hess, Doug Martin, Ben 
Hesse, Josh Walterscheid, and 
Art Bayer Sergeant At Arms. 

Auxiliary banner and color 
bearers were Janet Barnhill, 
Lucille Hesse, Ethel Hesse, 
Juanita Knabe, and Audrey 
Barnhill, with Linda Knabe 
conducting. 

Children placing flowers 
were Samantha Koester, 
Alane Bartush, Bailey Kle-
ment, Bradley Henscheid, 
Cody Dangelmayr, Bryce 
Herr, Morgan Eldridge, and 
Amy Luttmer. 

Graves outside the plot had 
been decorated earlier by 
Frances Bayer, Sandra Henni-
gan, Lucille Hesse, and Linda 
Knabe. 

Final event of the day was 
a bountiful dinner cooked and 
served by the Post cooking 
squad consisting of Don Hess, 
Virgil and Judy Hess, Tim and 
Vickie Hess, Hank Bayer, 
Johnny Rohmer, and Don 
Eckart. The Hall was deco-
rated by Frances Bayer. 

Margaret Zipper. New Arriv-
als: Lloyd to Ray and Irene 
Klement; Douglas to Arthur 
and Pauline Hellman. Wed-
ding: Bernice Miller and Paul 
Yosten. The Get-Together 
Club has lunch in Gainesville 
and then attends picture 
show. 

50 YEARS AGO  
May 31, 1957 

Herman "Pip" Fette is the 
new owner-manager of the 
SinClair Station in Muenster. 
NewArrivals: Karen to Albert 
and Wilda Stoffels; Cindy to 
A.J. and Girlie Felderhoff; a 
daughter to the Paul Lukes. 
Sacred Heart's Benedictine 
Sisters begin leaving for the 
motherhouse in Jonesboro for 
the summer. 

25 YEARS AGO 
May 28, 1982 

Muenster High Valedicto-
rian is Peggy Winn, Saluta-
torian is Rene Stelzer. Sacred 
Heart Valedictorian is Susie 
Felderhoff, Salutatorian is 
Gene Fuhrman. Obituaries: 
Evelyn (Mrs. Al) Schmitt, 64; 
William Shively, 27, grandson 
of Agnes Lehnertz, killed in 
car crash. Wedding: Marci 
Newbill and Charles 
McNeely. New Arrival: Ryan 
to George and Sharon Luke. 
Renate Hess earns high point 
trophy in Wichita Falls Red 
River Twirling Festival.  
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Jayna Rohmer - NCT(' 

Mabel and Leo Scott Dual 
Credit, NCTC MJC Memorial . 
Military Order of the Purple 
Heart, Chapter #744, NCTC 
First National Bank of Saint 
Jo; 

Kalyn Rohmer - NCTC MJC 
Memorial, Military Order of 
the Purple Heart, Chapter 
#744, NCTC First National 
Bank of Saint Jo; 

Zach Swirczynski - Austin 
College Academic, Austin Col-
lege Equalization Grant, The 
Law Offices of Jim A. 
Robertson; 

Michael Valliere - Fort Worth 
Scottish Rite Foundation, Inc., 
Muenster Kiwanis Club; 

Jose Velasquez - Westwood 
College; 

Bret Walterscheid - Cooke 
County Electric Cooperative, 
Muenster High School Band 
Boosters, Texas Public Educa-
tion Grant; 

Collin Walterscheid - Muen-
ster High School Principal's 
Scholarship; 

Jessica Walterscheid - NCTC 
Mabel & Leo Scott Dual Credit, 
Lead America, Cooke County 
Electric Cooperative, Muenster 
Memorial Hospital David 
Bright Memorial, Catholic Life 
Insurance, Midwestern State 
University Academic, Mid-
western State University 
President's Distinguished; 

Britney Wann - Saint Jo 
Bank - Muenster Branch, Kan-
sas University Scholars Award; 

Krystal Wolf- NCTC Leo and 
Mabel Scott Dual Credit, Will-
iam and Nancy Nelson 
Chicken Express, Texas Tech 
University Recruitment, Supe-
rior Scholarship Achievement 
Award. 

The grand total of all offered 
scholarships was $271,386. 
The accepted scholarship 
awards by the 2007 senior class 
was $200,786. 

Diplomas were awarded by 
Jim Endres, vice president of 
the MISD Board of Trustees 
and Principal Eldridge. Assis-
tant Principal Brandon Peavy 
presented the class. 

Chad Endres offered the 
benediction and the graduates 
recessed out to "Pomp and Cir-
cumstance" played by Justin 
Bell. 

To the Editor, 
Do we or don't we? This is 

a question that we have been 
Alcing since last July. The 
question is about the leash 
law in Muenster. 

Oh, we do have one on the 
books, but not, in theory. We 
don't have a "dogcatcher," so 
it's not being enforced. 

The people are being at-
tacked, their trash being torn 
up, dogs getting in private 
back yards, and just being a 
public nuisance overall. 

The situation has acceler-
ated since last July. The lo-
cal police, County law, City 
Hall, 911, and some City 
Council members have been 
contacted on numerous occa-
sions. 

The City manager prom-
ised us that it would be 
brought up in the February 
City Council meeting. How-
ever, another dog problem 
was talked about, but not 
ours. Nothing has been men-
tioned at the next two meet-
ings. 

When we call, we are told, 
"We'll take care of it." I 
haven't seen "we" taking care 
of anything. 

Last summer, my husband 
and myself and grandchil-
dren were attacked numer-
ous times. Since then, one of 
my grandsons is scared to 
walk in "Paw-Paw's" neigh-
borhood. 

We understand that it is 
not the dogs' fault. The own-
ers should be responsible 
enough to do something 
about their prob em. 

The Texas State Legisla-
ture passed a bill about men 

Dorothy Bayer 

Mass of Christian Burial 
was held for Dorothy Bayer 
at 10:30 a.m. Saturday, May 
26 in Sacred Heart Catholic 
Church in Muenster, with Fr. 
Ken Robinson officiating. In-
terment followed in Sacred 
Heart Cemetery. Services 
were under the direction of 
Sparkman/Crane Funeral 
Home of Dallas. 

Dorothy Bayer died in Dal-
las at the age of 63 at 12:30 
a.m. on May 24, 2007 due to 
cancer. 

Born Oct. 15, 1943 in 
Gainesville, Dorothy earned 
her Bachelor degree from the 
University of Texas in Arling-
ton and her Pharmacy degree 
from the University of Hous-
ton. 

Survivors are her mother, 
Anna Sandmann Bayer; sib-
lings, Sister Jeanette Bayer, 
Clarence Bayer and wife 
Frieda, Ruth Schwab and 
husband Jim, Cletus Bayer 
and wife Cynthia, and Cheryl 
Russell and husband Bill; 
and many nieces and neph-
ews. 

Preceding her in death was 
her father George Bayer and 
her sister Georgia Norvell. 

Before the funeral, viewing 
was held at 9:30 a.m. in Sa-
cred Heart Church, followed 
by a Rosary recited at 10 a.m. 
led by Clarence Bayer and 
Sister Jeanette Bayer. 

Assisting Fr. Ken at the 
funeral Mass were altar serv- 

acing dogs. It contains state 
prison time up to 20 years. 
The City and County don't 
have to keep passing the buck 
back and forth. This is a State 
Law. 

The question is do we or 
don't we have people in posi-
tion to make sure such prob-
lems are fixed? 

Linda F. Vogel 
Muenster, TX 

ers Nolan Hartman, Cole 
McAden, and Isaac Barnhill. 
Adam Bayer gave the First 
Reading. The Second Reading 
was read by Travis Bayer. 
Prayers of the Faithful were 
given by A.J. Schwab. Bill 
and Cheryl Russell and their 
son Trey carried up the Offer-
tory Gifts. Eucharistic minis-
ters were Mary Bayer, An-
nette Bayer, Carolyn Bayer, 
Frances Bayer, Ethel Bayer, 
and Alvin Hartman. 

Music ministers were Isaac 
Davis, pianist, and Christy 
Hesse. Sacred songs included 
"On Eagle's Wings," "You Are 
Near," "Be Not Afraid," and 
"Sing With All The Saints In 
Glory." 

Ben Bayer, nephew and 
Godchild of Dorothy remem-
bered his simple, straight for-
ward relationship with Dor-
othy. Ben found his God-
mother kind, compassionate, 
humble, intelligent, wonder-
ful with children, courageous, 
and loving. 

Dorothy's nephew Trey 
Russell recalled that "Aunt 
Dorothy was a loving person. 

She liked playing games... 
never gave up... was consid-
erate... liked to read... loved 
family... Aunt Dorothy was 
my favorite aunt." 

Bill Russell spoke of 
Dorothy's life. He said in part, 
"..As long as Anna and Trey 
can remember, Dorothy 
would come over on Wednes-
day evenings for dinner... 
usually meant a game night 
or swimming in the summer... 
Dorothy loved children. She 
was very artistic... so if there 
was a school project that 
needed some art 'assistance,' 
Dorothy was always pleased 
to sit and patiently watch a 
shoebox transform itself... 

"During her battle with 
cancer, Dorothy never gave 
up mentally or complained... 
Dorothy was a very loving -
open - person..." 

Pallbearers were A.J. 
Schwab, Ben Bayer, Adam 
Bayer, Travis Bayer, Jake 
Bayer, and Nick Bayer. 

For those who have asked, 
memorials can be made to Sa-
cred Heart Trust Fund or the 
charity of your choice. 

MISD GRADS 

DAYS GONE BY 

LETTER TO T HE EDITOR 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA  

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 
MEETING DATE June 4, 2007 

The following is the agenda for the regular meeting of 
the Muenster City Council to be held at 7:30 p.m. in the 
City Hall meeting room on Monday, June 4, 2007. 
1. Call meeting to order at 7:30 p.m. 
2. Opening prayer. 
3. Approve minutes of the regular meeting on May 7, 2007, 
and special meeting on May 21, 2007. 
4. Recognize visitors and invite them to attend the entire 
Council meeting and to discuss their business. 
5. Consider any other business to come before the Council. 
OLD BUSINESS 
1. None. 
NEW BUSINESS 
1. Consider and act on alderman commissioner positions 
and Mayor Pro-Tern position. 
2. Discuss nominations for alderman vacancy replacing 
Johnny Pagel. Take action as necessary. 
3. Consider and act on nomination for representative to 
Texoma Council of Governments governing body. 
4. Consider and act on request for City to bore under Ash 
Street for oil field line. 
5. Consider and act on culvert repairs at Third and Mes-
quite Streets. 
6. Consider and act on repair or replacement of jet router. 
7. Receive Proclamation of Appreciation from Texas Mu-
nicipal League Intergovernmental Employee Benefits Pool. 
8. Consider and act on budget amendment to Water & 
Sewer budget. 
9. Review and act on monthly bills. 	 "'at 
10. Receive status report on city projects and activities. 
Take action as necessary on items of discussion. 
11. Executive Session - The council may enter into execu-
tive session according to Texas Local government Code 
551.071 - Consultation with Attorney. 
12. Return to open session. Take action as necessary on 
matters discussed in executive session. 
13. Adjourn. 

Micallee Matson, City Secretary 

2-WEEK EVENTS CALENDAR To list yonr event, call 759-43I I BEFORE NOON WEDNESDAY! 
Sunday, June 3. 2007 Monday, June 4, 2007 Tuesday, June 5, 2007 Wednesday, June 6, 2007 Thursday, June 7, 2007 Friday, June 8, 2007 Saturday, June 9, 2007 

Muenster Museum Open 1-4 City Council mtg. 7:30 pm 

SACRED HEART 

TDH Immunization Clinic 
9- I lam. Cooke Co. Electric 
Chamber of Commerce 
Board mtg. 5:30 pm 

VACATION 

Muenster Museum Open I-4pm 

BIBLE 

Muenster Museum Open I-4pm 
AARP membership luncheon 
mtg., II:30am, Stanford House 
Forestburg Sesquicentennial 

SCHOOL 

Forestburg Sesquicentennial 

Sunday, June 10, 2007 Monday, June II, 2007 Tuesday, June 12, 2007 Wednesday, June 13, 2007 Thursday, June 14, 2007 Friday, June 15, 2007 Saturday, June 16.2007 

Muenster Museum Open I-4 
Forestburg Sesquicentennial 

VFW mtg. 8pm 
No MMH Aux. mtg. 

MISD Board mtg. 7:30 pm Muenster Museum Open I-4pm 
Muenster Historical Comm. mtg. 
8am Rohmer's Restaurant 
C of C Luncheon mtg. noon 
Rohrner . , Restaurant 

Muenster Museum Open 14pm 
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Crowder, Walterscheid exchange vows in St. Peter's Church 
Amy Celeste Crowder and 

Ronald Jon Walterscheid 
were married at a Nuptial 
Mass celebrated in St. Peter's 
Catholic Church in Lindsay 
at 4:30 p.m. on April 14, 2007. 
Celebrant of the Mass was Fr. 
Kyle Walterscheid of Fort 
Worth, with Fr. Ron Scheible, 
pastor of St. Peter's, con-cel-
ebrating. 

Parents of the couple are 
Pat and Debby Crowder of 
Collinsville and Jerry and 
Betty Rose Walterscheid of 
Muenster. 

Mass servers were Traci 
Walterscheid of Grapevine 
and Abby Walterscheid of 
Muenster, both Godchildren 
of the groom. 

The bride was given in 
marriage by her parents and 
escorted by her father. 

Celeste was wearing an Al. 
fred Angelo white gown. The 
strapless bodice was banded 
with an edge of claret red 
satin trimmed with white em-
broidery, pearls, and crystal 
beads. The back of the dress 
was laced corset style, with 
the chapel length train at-
tached at the waist. Tiny cov-
ered buttons centered the 
back of the train. The back 
bodice and train were claret 
red. The train was also em-
bellished with white embroi-
dered pearls and crystal  

beads. The bride carried a 
nosegay of Charlotte and 
Black Magic roses entwined 
with the rosary the groom's 
mother carried 46 years ago 
at her wedding. 

ATTENDANTS 
Matrons of Honor were sis-

ters of the bride Stefanie Irick 
of Pilot Point and Natalie 
Cross of Greenwood. Brides-
maids were Dr. Mindy Kle-
ment of Moss Lake and Holly 
O'Dell of Gainesville, friends 
of the bride, and Tina Cox of 
Muenster, Godmother of the 
bride. 

The attendants were at-
tired in floor length, black, 
halter type dresses. Each car-
ried a nosegay similar to the 
bride's. 

Flower girl was Maci Cross 
of Greenwood, niece of the 
bride. She was dressed in 
white with claret red trim 
matching the bride's dress. 
For her flowers, Maci carried 
a kissing ball of red sweet-
heart roses. Flowers were 
made by Lora's Flowers of 
Muenster. 

The groom's best man was 
his brother Doug Waltersc-
heid of Grapevine. Grooms-
men were Doug Fleitman and 
Frank Fangman of Muenster, 
friends of the couple, Darren 
Voth of Moss Lake, friend of 
the groom, and John Walter- 

scheid of Muenster, brother of 
the groom. Ringbearer was 
Colton Popp of Lindsay, 
cousin of the groom. 

Ushers were Travis Irick of 
Pilot Point and Codey Cross 
of Greenwood, brothers-in-
law of the bride, Jeff Arendt 
of Lindsay, and Troy Huchton 
of Muenster, friends of the 
groom. 

Organist was Fran Schully 
and vocalist was Katie Cox of 
Muenster. 

Music before Mass in-
cluded "Unchained Melody," 
"I Can Only Imagine," and 
"Jesu, Joy of Man's Desiring." 

The song played during the 
seating of the parents was "I 
Will Be Here." The music for 
the procession of the atten-
dants was "Pachelbel's Canon 
in D." The bridal processional 
was "Wagner's Bridal Cho-
rus." 

Readings for the Mass were 
given by Leigh Walterscheid 
of Grapevine, sister-in-law of 
the groom, and Lisa Kupper 
of Valley View, aunt of the 
groom. 

Chris Walterscheid of 
Grapevine, Godchild of the 
groom, carried a lighted 
blessed candle to be placed on  

the side altar in memory of 
Leroy Kupper, Godfather of 
the groom. 

Offertory Gifts were pre-
sented by the Chris and Gina 
Craigie family. Chris and 
Gina are the family sponsor 
couple for Ronnie and Ce-
leste. 

Eucharistic ministers were 
Dana Walterscheid of Muen-
ster, sister-in-law of the 
groom, Ginger Kupper of 
Rockwall, aunt and God-
mother of the groom, Anne 
Walterscheid of Muenster, 
niece of the groom, and Jen-
nifer Popp of Lindsay, cousin 
of the groom. 

The song at the lighting of 
the Unity Candle was "The 
Prayer." During the presen-
tation of the Gifts, "Lord Of 
All Hopefulness" was sung. 
The Communion song was 
"How Beautiful," and during 
the presentation of flowers at 
Mary's Altar, "Ave Maria" was 
sung. The recessional was 
Mendelssohn's "Wedding 
March." 

Greeters who handed out 
programs for the wedding 
ceremony were Lora Walter-
scheid of Muenster, niece of 
the groom, and Katie Arendt 
of Lindsay, friend of the 
couple. 

RECEPTION 
A dinner and dance at 

Lindsay Centennial Hall fol-
lowed the ceremony, and was 
hosted by the parents of the 
couple. Anne and Sara 
Walterscheid of Muenster, 
nieces of the groom, regis-
tered 380 guests. 

The hall was decorated 
with flowers of red roses, 
white alstromeria, and 
candles. 

The bride's cake was a four 
tier, petal shaped cake ac-
cented with red roses and 
white alstromeria. The base  

of each layer was banded with 
white ribbon and red en-
twined hearts. 

The groom's cake was in 
the shape of the deer feeder 
on a stand. The front held a 
W monogram. The groom's 
table was skirted in black 
with a camouflage overlay. A 
picture of the groom with a 
deer was on the table. Both 
cakes were made by the 
groom's mother. 

The punch and snack 
tables were taken care of by 
Janell and Lisa Kupper, 
aunts of the groom. The meal 
was catered by Rohmer's Res-
taurant. After the meal, a 
dessert table was set up for 
the enjoyment of the guests. 
Lora Hennigan helped with 
this. 

Billy Hogan and friends 
had their band there for danc-
ing, and the D.J. for the night 
was Lambert Hess. 

A highlight of the evening 
for the young children was 
when the limo arrived and 
the driver took all the chil-
dren for a drive around town. 

The couple honeymooned 
on a Western Carribean 
cruise. 

Ron and Celeste are at 
home in Muenster. 

Special guests at the wed- 
ding were grandmothers 
Margaret Kupper, Ola Faye 
Burkham, and Foy Crowder. 

Rehearsal dinner was • 

hosted by the groom's parents 
Friday night before the wed-
ding at the home of David and ' 
Shelli Fleitman of Lindsay, 
with about 60 guests attend-
ing. Special guests were 
Carol Lingenfelter of Sanger, 
California, Kathi Cardoza of 
Fresno, California, and Dick 
and Dorothy Altmann of 
Stratford, Wisconsin who 
came to celebrate the wed-
ding . 

MMH announces David 
M. Bright Memorial 
Scholarships recipients 

Danielle Bindel, Amy Dangel- 
mayr Brad Donald Endres, 

Jessica essica Marie Waltersc- , 
heid. Each scholarship is for 
$500. 

The scholarships will be 
available each year to anyone 
wishing to go into a medical 
field. New applications will be 
available in January of 2008. 

Is Sponsoring a blood drive to 
benefit Krista Brewer on June 2nd 
from I lam - 3pm in Cooke County 

Burgers N' More parking lot! 

June 2007 Menu  
1) 2 lb. Salisbury Steak lino, 	1 ,  16 oz. Sliced Frozen Carrot. 

(1) 2 lb. St. Louis Ribs 	 1116 oz. Corn  
1) 2 lb. Chicken 'Anders 	(1) 24 oz. Steak-Cut French Fro- 

(1) 18 oz. Stuffed Manicotti 	(1) 8 oz. Corn Muffin Mix 
(8) 4 oz. Country Fried Beef Steaks(1) 1 lb. White Rice 
(1) 2 lb. Chicken Breast Fillets 	(1) 14 oz. Peanut Butter 
( 1) 6.5 oz. Lasagna Hamburger Dinner (1) 10 ct. Waffles 
(1) 7.5 oz. Ranch & Bacon Pasta Salad (1) Each, Dessert Item 
(1) 16 oz. Pinto Beans 

ALL THIS FOR THE LOW COST OF JUST $25 00  
One or More Specials Available Only with the 

Purchase of a Regular Box 
June Special #1 

5.5 lb. Grill Box - $18.00 
(4) 8 oz. New York Strips (4) 6 oz. Pork Chops 
(1) 1 lb. Italian Sausage (1) 1 lb. Chicken Breast Fillet 

June Special #2  
5.5 lb. BBQ Box - $18.00 

41 6 oz. Baseball-cut Sirloin Steaks (4) 4 oz. Steakburgers 
(4) 4 oz. Bacon-wrapped Sirloin Filets 2 lbs. Beef Back Ribs 

June Suecial #3  
10 lb. Chicken Combo - $17.00 

2 lbs. Wings 	 2 lbs. Breaded Nuggets 
2 lbs. Breaded Tenders 2 lbs. Breaded Frying Chicken 

2 lbs. IQF Boneless/Skinless Chicken Breast 

SACRED HEART PARISH 
June Order Dates: 

Sat., June 9 & Sat., June 16 - After Mass 
Sun., June 10 & Sun., June 17 - 9-10:15am & 11:30-12.00 
or call Kathy Vogel 902-9894 or Agnes Hesse 759-413)) 
All orders MUST be received by Sunday, June 17! 
Distribution Day: Sat., June 30, 8:30-10:30 am 

We accept Food Stamps (EBT). 

Muenster Memorial Hospi-
tal is proud to announce the 
first winners of the annual 
David M. Bright Memorial 
Scholarship. The scholar-
ships are awarded to persons 
pursuing careers in the medi-
cal fields. 

This year's winners are 
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Submit to God and be at peace with Him; 
in this way prosperity will come to you. 

- Job 22-21 

An excerpt from 

The Church's Love Letter to the World 
by Rev. Richard John Neuhaus 
Part 3 of 12 

Prophetic humanism knows that the choice is not be-
tween the will of God and the well-being of humanit 
Rather, the will of God is for our well-being, and our 
well-being is in doing the will of God. Jesus said, "I 
came so that they might have life and have it more 
abundantly" (Jn 10:10). This is the great truth of pro-
phetic humanism that gives such urgency to the love 
letter that is Evangelium Vitae: "May these words reach 
all the sons and daughters of the Church!" the encycli-
cal declares. "May they reach all people of good will 
who are concerned for the good of every man and 
woman and for the destiny of the whole of society!" 
(no. 5) 

Taking part in the recital were, from left, front - Hannah Bayer, Mikaela Lamar, James Dangelmayr, 
Gabbi Mellinger. Alana Endres. Lora Walterscheid, Taryn Stringfellow; middle - Ashton Reynolds, 
Georgia Taylor-Saavedra. Hunter Garrett, Nealie Sanchez, Chisam Reiter, Abby Walterscheid; back 
- Rosemary Dankesreiter, Jordan Brown. Sara Walterscheid, Lucinda Krahl, Amy Nortman, Christopher 
Klement. Victoria Endres. Audrey Taylor-Saavedra, Brooklyn Fatheree. and Kendall Neu. 
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Piano students present recital 
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Piano keys danced, toes 
tapped, and voices hummed 
at a piano recital held Sun-
day. May 20 at 7 p.m. in the 
Muenster Public School Au-
ditorium. 

Classical, traditional, pop, 
American folk, and spiritual 
tunes were enjoyed by a large 
crowd of parents, grandpar-
ents, relatives, and friends as 
22 piano students presented 
selections from their year's 
repertoires. 

The evening began as Rose-
mary Dankesreiter welcomed 
students and those attending. 
She praised the class for their 
excellent work, determina-
tion, and dedication this year. 
She then introduced each stu-
dent and noted the number of 
years of piano study. 

Muenster student, James 
Dangelmayr performed in the 
recital after receiving only six 
months of piano lessons. 

Alana Endres of Muenster, 
Gabbi Hellinger of Myra, and 
Chisam Reiter of Lindsay 
completed their first year. 

Students finishing their 
second year were Lora 
Walterscheid, Hannah Bayer, 
Victoria Endres, Georgia Tay-
lor-Saavedra, and Audrey 
Taylor-Saavedra, all of Muen-
ster, and Taryn Stringfellow 
of Lindsay. 

Seven students finished 
three years: Mikayla Lamar 
and Abby Walterscheid of 
Muenster; Kendall Neu, 
Nealie Sanchez, and Christo-
pher Klement of Lindsay; 
Ashton Reynolds of Gaines- 

Mikaela Lamar. 
A special trophy was pre-

sented to Georgia Taylor-
Saavedra for "Most Improved 
Student" in 2007. 

The stage was beautifully 
decorated with greenery and 
floral arrangements. The pi-
ano held a large candelabra 
and trailing flowering vine. 
Flanking the piano and add-
ing elegance to the recital 
scene was a pedestal table 
adorned with a floral 
arrangment. Large potted ivy 
framed the stage. 

At the entrance to the au-
ditorium, a table held a bou-
quet of lavender and white 
mums, a votive candle, and 
the recital programs. 

Following the recital, all 
enjoyed refreshments of 
punch and cookies. 

subnutend Rowerno, Dan!, 

Flag Etiquette 
On a staff 

When the U.S. flag is flown 
with the flags or pennants of 
states, cities, or societies, it 
should always be at the peak. 
When flown from adjacent 
staffs, the U.S. flag should be 
hoisted first and lowered last. 

Showing respect 
When the flag is raised, 

lowered, or is passing in a 
parade or review, everyone 
present, except the military 
personnel, should face the 
flag and place his or her hand 
over their heart. Men remove 
their hats. Military personnel 
salute. 

irtfriends 

Emily Szymanski 

Szymanski 
Tony and Erica Szymanski 

of Allen announce the birth of 
their daughter Emily Jose-
phine. She was born Tuesday, 
April 24, 2007 at Presbyte-
rian Hospital of Plano weigh-
ing 7 lb. 6 oz. and measuring 
18 1/2 inches in length. Emily 
is welcomed by her big sister 
Isabel, age 2 1/2 years. 
Grandparents are Sharlene 
and Duwayne Schilling of 
Muenster, and Linda 
Szymanski of Marathon, Wis-
consin and the late Terrence 
Szymanski. Great-grandpar-
ents are Charlie Wimmer of 
Muenster and the late Isabel 
Wimmer, the late Frank and 
Caroline Schilling, the late 
Elizabeth and Stanley 
Szymanski, and the late Do-
lores and Alphonse Blume. 

Sandmann 
Nathan and Yvonne Sand-

mann of Valley View an-
nounce the birth of their 
daughter Chloe Mae Sand-
mann on Saturday, May 5, 
2007 at 11:51 a.m. Chloe was 
born at Wilson N. Jones Hos-
pital weighing 6 lb. 6 oz. and 
measuring 19 inches long. 
Her brother is Caleb Sand- 

Holly Ann Harris-Bayer 
graduated from Texas Chris-
tian University's M.J. Neeley 
School of Business in Fort 
Worth with a Master of Busi-
ness Administration on May 
12. The commencement cer-
emony was held at Daniel-
Meyer Coliseum on the TCU 
campus. On May 11, the M.J. 
Neeley School of Business 
hosted its Spring 2007 Hood-
ing Ceremony for graduating 
MBAs and MAcs at Ed 
Landreth Auditorium on the 
TCU campus. During this 
ceremony, Holly was hooded 
by dignitaries from the Nee-
ley School. The hood Holly 
was bestowed bared the col-
ors of TCU and her chosen 
academic field. 

In addition to receiving her 
academic regalia at this spe-
cial ceremony, Holly was also 
named a Neeley Scholar. In 
Holly's graduating class, this 
honor was only given to those 
students graduating within 
the top 10% of their class. 
Throughout graduate school, 
Holly maintained a 3.953  

mann, age 3. Grandparents 
are Ernest and Laneta Mar-
tin of Muenster, and Betty 
and Gary Sandmann of 
Gainesville. Great-grandpar-
ents are Nellie Martin of 
Muenster, Weldon and Peggy 
Reid of Muenster, Gloria 
Derheim of Gainesville, and 
Henry and Lorene Sandmann 
• 
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Thoina, Anthony Schad 
graduated cum laude with 
two undergraduate degrees 
from the University of Notre 
Dame in South Bend, Indiana 
during commencement exer-
cises May 22. 

Thomas received a Bach-
elor of Science Degree in 
Physics and a Bachelor of 
Arts Degree in Philosophy. 
He was recognized by the 
Notre Dame College of Sci-
ence for best research presen-
tation in Physics. While at 
Notre Dame, Tom completed 
physics internships in solar 

GPA, which ranked her 3 0  in 
her graduating class of 38 
Professional MBAs. During 
her rust year of graduate 
school. Holly had the distinct 
opportunity to study abroad 
in Cologne, Germany during 
a summer semester. 

Holly graduated Summa 
Cum Laude (4.0 GPA) with a 
Bachelor of Business Admin-
istration in Electronic Busi-
ness & Finance from Texas 
Christian University in 2003. 
She is also a 1999 graduate 
of Saint Jo High School. 

Holly is the daughter of 
Rebecca Harris of Saint Jo 
and the late Van Harris. She 
is the granddaughter of Coy 
and Mary Nell Mosley of 
Saint Jo and the late Prentis 
Harris. Holly resides in 
Lewisville with her husband 
Brandon and daughter Macy. 

Family Swim 
Nights slated 

The Muenster Kiwanis 
Club has scheduled their an-
nual Family Swim Nights. 
The dates chosen are June 7, 
June 21, July 5, July 19, and 
Aug. 2. Gates are open from 
7 to 9 p.m. Children must be 
accompanied by an adult. 

McCloud to 
speak June 20 

Ralph McCloud, Diocesan 
Director of Peace and Justice, 
and former mayor pro-tem of ; 
Fort Worth, will be coming to 
the Sacred Heart Community : • 
Center Meeting Room on i 
Wednesday, June 20, after 
the 6:30 p.m. Mass (about 7 
p.m.), to do a presentation on 
The Eucharist and Social -

.Justice." Everyone is invited. 

Thomas Schad 

physics at Montana State 
University and at the Na-
tional Solar Observatory in 
Sunspot, New Mexico. 

This summer, Thomas will 
present his research at the 
AURA Solar Physics annual 
meeting in Honolulu, Hawaii. 
He plans to pursue his mas-
ters degree in solar physics at 
the University of Arizona at 
Tucson where he has been 
granted a graduate research 
assistantship. He is a 2003 
graduate of SubiacoAcademy 
in Subiaco, Ark. 

Thomas is the son of Elaine 
and E. J. Schad of Valley 
View. He is the grandson of 
Nancy Krahl of Gainesville 
and Louise Schad of Lindsay. 
He is the great-grandson of 
Ethel Kammerdiener of 
Gainesville. Attending the 
graduation were his rliother; 
his sister Emmy Schad, and 
friend Harry Bryant, both of : 
Dallas. 

NEW ARRIVALS 

ville; and Hunter Garrett of 
Whitesboro. 

Mastering five years of 
study were Lucinda Krahl of 
Lindsay, Jordan Brown of 
Era, and Brooklyn Fatheree 
of Nocona. 

Topping the class were 
Sara Walterscheid of Muen-
ster and Amy Nortman of 
Lindsay with eight years of 
piano training. 

After the introductions, 
Jordan Brown led everyone in 
an opening prayer. Then each 
student played one or two 
memorized selections. 

Following the recital, rec-
ognition was given by Mrs. 
Dankesreiter to the five stu-
dents who participated in the 
UIL piano solo competition 
held at Gainesville High 
School on March 3. Those 
were Sara Walterscheid 
Christopher Klement, Brook-
lyn Fatheree, Jordan Brown, 
and Amy Nortman. Special 
recognition was given to Amy 
Nortman for advancing to the 
State competition where she 
competed on May 28 playing 
"Mazurka Opus 24" by 
Frederic Chopin. 

Mrs. Dankesreiter pre-
sented each student with a 
certificate of accomplishment 
and each also was awarded a 
statuette of a famous com-
poser. 

Trophies were presented to 
the winners in the Perfection 
and Memorization Contest. 
Receiving 1st place was Han-
nah Bayer, 2nd place Abby 
Walterscheid. and 3rd place 
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Harris-Bayer earns 
Master's degree 

Schad graduates cum 
laude from Notre Dame 

Come listen to Hard Times 
& Celebrate the Good Times 
Our Celebration wraps Up Saturday, 

June 9th with Only in T000kts 
June Live Music 
6/2 Hard Times Ozeunit4 

6/9 Only in Texans 
6/15 Willie Kickit 
6/22 Bois D'arcs 

6/23 Joe Pat Hennen 
6/30 Alley Cats 

FISH DAYS 
FORGET CATCHING THE FISH TRUCK! 
WE HAVE FISH EVERY DAY FOR PICKUP OR DELIVERY. 

This Weeks's S  t  ecial 4-6" Channel Catfish $25/100.* 
Mon-Fri 8:00-5:00, & Sat 8:00-12:00 

Moss Problems? Stocking Questions? 

Call Aggie Biologist - Brad Metzler 

Pond King Inc. is just West of Lindsay on Hwy 82 
BASS-BLUEGILL-CRAPPIE-CATFISH-MINNOWS 

940-668-2573 or www.pondking.com  
*Limited to 200 per customer 

Get Your 
Annual Shots 

at Doc's. 
Fvery Friday 

Enchiladas, Tacos al Carbon, 
or Margarita Chicken 

& Drink Specials 

aaturday_Nite 
Bourbon Ribeye or 
Chicken Louisiana 

113 N. Main St. • 759-2031 
www.doesbarandgrill.com  



Sara Walterscheid 
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Walterscheid girls win Gold, Silver, and Bronze 
Anne iilalterscheid earns Gold Award 

The "ultimate" Girl Scout 
,goal: the Gold Award. The 
Girl Scout Gold Award is 
strived for by many, but only 
achieved by a few. Ten years 
ago a little girl said, "Mommy, 
can I be a Girl Scout?" 
Mommy said, "Yes," and a 
gild range of giggles and 
:creams came from the little 
girl as she helped pick out her 
new uniform and books to go 
to her first meeting. At the 
age of seven, she experienced 
her first outdoor camping 
trip, cooking on a campfire, 
flag ceremony, campfire skits, 
and Girl Scout songs. She 
learned the Girl Scout Prom-
ise and Girl Scout Law. She 
also learned the joy of mak-
ing many new friends and 
learning many new things. 
Brownie Girl Scouting was 
fun. 

Fourth through sixth grade 
Junior Scouting was a little 
more challenging. Badges 
took a little more effort. There 
was more emphasis on teach-
ing the "little girls" and earn-
ing the Junior Aide Patch and 
safety awards. Cookie sales 
were great with competition 
to sell the most! Many back-
yard camp-outs took place, 
plus earning the Polar Bear 
patch for camping in weather 
below freezing. Let's not for-
get the sniper hunts. Her 
Bronze Award was earned by 
assisting the Jaycees in build-
ing the new baseball park. 
This was quite rewarding for 
her. Not only was she the first 
ever in Cooke County to earn 
it, but also because it was the 
beginning of the challenge to 
get to the Gold. A trip to Sa-
vannah, Georgia, which is the 
birthplace of Juliette Gordon 
Low, the founder of Girl 
Scouts, was the highlight of 
the summer. Junior Girl 
Scouting was adventurous. 

As a Cadette Girl Scout, 

this little girl proved to be not 
so little anymore. She took on 
many responsibilities. Plan-
ning and carrying out county 
events were only a few. Many 
hours of service to her com-
munity, trainings with her 
troop, and teaching younger 
girls the meaning of honesty, 
respect, and responsibility 
became her main focus. She 
thrived on the "little" girls 
looking up to her for direction 
and answers. She taught 
many girls the skills needed 
for camping, cooking, hiking, 
orienteering, archery, canoe-
ing, and ceremonies. She per-
formed as a soloist for several 
award ceremonies and ban-
quets. She participated in a 
Statewide Cadette Camp in 
Conroe in which several 
awards were received for cre-
ativity, style, and leadership. 
She earned her Silver Award 
by completely remodeling the 
upstairs room in the Knights 
of Columbus Hall. Cadette 
Girl Scouting was challeng-
ing. 

All grown up now, this 
young lady has reached her 
goal time and time again. Al-
ways wanting to succeed and 
live up to expectations, she 
has continued in Girl Scout-
ing despite the sayings of "It's 
not cool,' "I don't have time," 
or "I have better things to do." 
Her thoughts on the subject: 
"Many great women in his-
tory were Girl Scouts," "I'm 
not a quitter," and "There's no 
place better to meet new 
people, learn new things, and 
go more places." Several fa-
mous Girls Scouts include 
Laura Bush - First Lady, San-
dra Day O'Connor - Supreme 
Court Justice, Lt. Col. Eileen 
Collins - first woman space 
shuttle commander, Mary 
Tyler Moore - actress, and 
Dorothy Hamill - Gold Medal 
figure skater, to name a few. 

Anne Walterscheid has met 
this challenge as a Senior 
Girl Scout. The Gold Award 
Project can finally begin. 
Leadership, delegation, and 
community service are the 
key factors of the Gold Award. 
In September 2006, after 
completing all badge require-
ments for her Gold Award, 
Anne attended the Cross 
Timbers Gold Award Alliance 
Committee meeting in Lewis-
ville. At this meeting, she had 
to propose her plan of action 
and get it approved by the 
Alliance before any work on 
the project could be started. 
With her proposal, the Alli-
ance had their doubts. "It's 
too hard for you," they said. 
"You'll need lots of help," they 
said. "You can try if you want 
to," they said. 

Well, that was all Anne 
needed to accept the chal-
lenge. "I'll use my resources," 
she said. And so it began. 
Talking with the mayor, City 
Council, Muenster Park 
Board, and Muenster Jay-
cees, Anne received approval 
to start renovation of the Old 
Ball Park. It's a great park 
and holds memories for so 
many people. It just needed 
a little care. On Feb. 25, nick-
naming her project, "Project 
Home Run," Anne began 
powerwashing, patching con-
crete, pouring a concrete side-
walk, sanding, and clearing 
brush in preparation of re-
painting the entire stadium. 

"Hours?" you may ask. The 
minimum hours required to 
achieve the Gold Award is 60. 
Of course we all know, a sta-
dium cannot be completed 
that quickly. "Resources?" 
you may ask. Let's just say 
there were many. 

Calling on family, friends, 
and the Sacred Heart Youth 
Group, painting of the rail-
ings, seating, bathrooms,  

dugouts, and batter's cage 
was completed. An afternoon 
shoveling dirt from the infield 
to the outfield low spots 
ended in a great hotdog cook-
out and ballgame. New 
counters were also installed 
in both bathrooms and cur-
tains hung for the girls. A wel-
corned guest, Mayor Henry 
Weinzapfel, came to view the 
completed project and offer 
his congratulations on a "job 
well done." 

The project with a total of 
187 hours and 28 volunteers 
was completed on April 1. Fi-
nal paperwork, logged hours, 
pictures, and scrapbook were 
met with a "WOW, WON-
DERFUL, AMAZING, 
GREAT JOB, YOU REALLY 
DID IT" at the final council 
review committee meeting. 
Great comments were re-
ceived from many people 
around town and friends from 
out of town. Senior Girl 
Scouting is "top of the line." 

Anne was recognized for 
this achievement and re-
ceived her Gold Award at the 
Annual Girl Scouts Cross 
Timber Council Awards Cer-
emony on April 21 at the Uni-
versity of North Texas cam-
pus in Denton. She was also 
recognized by the Circle T 
Council of Fort Worth. Anne 
will attend a statewide recog-
nition ceremony and banquet 
at the Texas State Capitol 
with Governor Rick Perry on 
June 4. 

Anne will be a senior at 
Muenster Public School in 
the Fall of 2007. She is a 
member of Sacred Heart 
Church, the Sacred Heart 
Youth Group S.H.Y., FCCLA, 
and Cross Country and Track 
teams. Her hobbies include 
ceramics, camping, shopping, 
community service, and 
spending time with friends. 
She has worked on collecting  

donations for VISTO and 
ABBA. She also is involved 
with the Master Gardeners 
cleanup and Keep Muenster 
Beautiful projects. 

She is the daughter of John 
and Dana Walterscheid and 
granddaughter of Tom and 

Muenster Girl 
Scout Sara 
Walterscheid has 
successfully com-
pleted her Silver 
Award Project. 
The Silver Award 
is the highest 
award earned by 
a girl in the 7th 
through 9th grade 
Cadette Girl 
Scout level. Sara 
was recognized 
for her achieve-
ment at the An-
nual Girls Scouts 
Cross Timbers 
Council Awards 
Ceremony on 
April 21 at the University of 
North Texas campus in Den-
ton. 

The Silver Award focuses 
on community service, work-
ing with others, leadership, 
and the importance of follow-
ing through with a project. 
The girl has an opportunity 
to give service back to her 
community by using her 
skills, talents, and resources. 
The project must be preceded 
by specific badge work 
completion, leadership train-
ing, project planning, and 
presentation of intent. The 
project requires a minimum 
of 30 hours of planning and 
execution. 

For her Silver Award 
Project, Sara chose to help in 
the continued project of re-
modeling and improving the 
Knights of Columbus Hall in 
Muenster. She helped the 
Knights in removing the wall 
that divided the downstairs 
room, cleaned out the large 
storage room and serving bar, 
took down old wallpaper in 
the women's restroom, and 
gave the whole downstairs a 
fresh coat of paint. She also 

Rosemary Dankesreiter and 
Jerry and Betty Rose Walter-
scheid. 

When asked "Are you fin-
ished now or what's next?" 
Anne's reply is "I'm training 
to be a Girl Scout Leader!" 

d he John Walterscheal 

made new curtains with the 
assistance of her grand-
mother Betty Rose Waltersc-
heid to match the upstairs 
room. Sara learned and as-
sisted in the placement of 
new ceiling fans, and also put 
a handicapped grab bar in the 
women's restroom. 

Sara felt this to be a worth-
while project for the commu-
nity because many activities 
such as fund-raisers, funeral 
meals, wedding receptions, 
graduation parties, and re-
unions take place there. She 
felt everyone should be a part 
of taking care of the commu-
nity and passing on good mor-
als and standards to the 
younger generation. 

Sara has been a member of 
Girl Scout Troop 998 for the 
past 10 years. She has now 
bridged to the Senior Level in 
Girl Scouting and will con-
tinue her service to the com-
munity as she begins work on 
requirements for her Gold 
Award. She is the daughter of 
John and Dana Walterscheid, 
and the granddaughter of 
Thomas and Rosemary 
Dankesreiter and Jerry and 
Betty Rose Walterscheid. 

(Clockwise from left) 

Anne Walterscheid 

paints a cinderblock 

wall at the ballpark, 

patches a hole in the 

cement, power 

washes the cement, 

works with a large 

group of volunteers 

to level the playing 

field and mixes 

cement for patching 

holes and cracks. 

Silver Award given 
to Sara Walterscheid 

Sara Walterscheid sewing new curtains for her project. 

Abby Walterscheid earns the girl Scout Bronze Award 

(Above) Abby Walterscheid at the awards 
ceremony. (Left) Abby measures material for a 

gown before sewing her project. 

The Girl Scout Bronze 
Award was presented to Abby 
Walterscheid at the Annual 
Girl Scouts Cross Timbers 
Council Awards Ceremony on 
April 21 on the University of 
North Texas campus in Den-
ton. The Bronze Award is the 
top award earned by a girl in 
the 4th through 6th grade 
Junior Girl Scout level. 

Working on leadership, 
community service, and 
world awareness badges, 
Abby completed all necessary 
requirements prior to begin-
ning her project. The project 
itself must be at least 15 
hours in length and benefit 
the community. 

Abby selected to use her 
sewing skills to make gowns,  

reversible caps, and pillows 
for children at the Scottish 
Rite Hospital in Dallas. She 
also put together gift bags of 
coloring books, activities, 
games, and toys to cheer up 
the kids. 

Scottish Rite Hospital was 
first founded as a treatment 
center for polio patients. 
Since then, it has expanded 
to care for general orthope-
dics, neurology deficits, and 
dental care of children up to 
18 years of age. It is totally 
funded by donations received 
and does not charge the fami-
lies. 

Abby saw first-hand the 
manufacturing department 
of prosthetics, physical 
therapy center, occupational  

therapy center, and the ways ,; 
in which the hospital takes • 
the stress and worry out of ; 
kids having to come for fre-
quent care. Abby presented ; 
her items to the hospital vol-
unteers who are an integral 
part of the hospital staff. 

Abby has been a Girl Scout ; 
in Troop 16 for seven years. 
She is the daughter of John 
and Dana Walterscheid, and 
granddaughter of Thomas 
and Rosemary Dankesreiter 
and Jerry and Betty Rose 
Walterscheid. 

Abby bridged up to the 
Cadette Level in Scouting 
during a troop year-end cer-
emony and looks forward to 
beginning requirements and -
work on her Silver Award. 



excited at the same time. 	the "Round Robin" games 
The team members who at- played each other for the 

ended the meet were: Aus- championship. The ICCS 
in Miller, Austin Springer, team won the meet, but the 

Andrew Ware, Chris Bartush, SHCS team learned some in-

4oe Bartush, Teresa Boles, teresting new moves and 
pare Davidson, Cooper vowed to triumph next year. 
Eddleman, Mikayla Fleit- 
hien, Mikenzie Fleitman, 	After the tournament, the 

evin Flusche, Brooke Sacred Heart team cheered- 
enry, Kylie Hess, Morgan up tremendously when bus 
esse, Karleigh Reeves, Tavi driver, Mr. Wade Waltersc- 
aldana, Bailey Waltersc- heid, stopped at Braums and 

heid, and Peyton Reiter. graciously bought everyone 
The invitation to compete ice-cream. The event was a 
as graciously extended by wonderful learning experi- p
as Principal Mrs. Elaine ence for both teams, and they 

Schad and Chess Coach Mr. made some new friends. 
, ;, ,erge Feigle. They offered Submitted by Barbara LaChance 

Muenster Kindergarten classes graduate May 22 

ATM & Drive Thru 

NOW OPEN 
24 Hour ATM 

Drive-Thru 
Monday - Friday 8 00 am - 6.00 pm 

Sa turday 800 am - Noon 

Lobby 
Monday Thursday 9 00 am 4 00 pm 

Friday 9 00 am 6.00 pm 

Gainesville 
California & Grand 

665-8700 

Also located in Lindsay at Hwy 82 & Pecan. 

MI Landmark 
r4 Bank 

800-618-5503 
landmarkbank.com  

MEMBER FDIC 

Xfoi 	41 It 41  
f$ 	I E. 

41 	L'. 	* 
Muenster Kindergarten Class of 2007 

NOW ON THE AIR WORLDWIDE ON 
THE INTERNET AT www.knfxradio.com  

Listen while you work or at home 

The Greatest hits of the 60's & 70's 
plus local news, weather, & sports. 

Its Hometown Radio at its Bean VtAs  ammo 

Get added peace of mind with 
SecureIT Plus Parental Controls! 

ACCESS CONTROLS 
• Create mull,* uter mottles 

• Enable/doable parental control,. 

• Windows username integration 

• Pestered protected user profiles 

• Immediate merrele of blocked content 

CONTENT FILTERING 
• Block pages based on keywords and patterns that 

appear in welt addresses 

• Web chat and instant message blocking 

• Stop dishing attempts 

• File download and file share protection 

TIME MANAGEMENT CONTROLS 
Control Internet surfing chatting and game plawng 
to a tine and duration appaginate lot each child 

• Umn the number of hours each child on use the 
computer. per day or by week 

• Spec eogram time restratons 

MONITORING/REPORTING 
• Web activrty reporting 

• Datly or weekly summary reports 

• Detailed Int of URLs ogled 

• Notificattens by penal of Inappropriate laces ,  
• Logging  of security violations 

Prevent your child from 
becoming a statistic 

70% of sexual advances over the Internet 

happen while youngsters were on a hone 

computer. One In five kids ages 10-17 

have been propositioned for CYborao,  

r“ .c. - Lcgal f,Ra. NM. 2 

Guaranteed Computer Protection 

Only $5 per month 

ORDER NOW 
940-759-2251 

www.nortex.com  
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SCHOOL 
;H Chess team plays 

in first tournament 
great hospitality to the SHCS 
team and provided pizza and 
drinks for lunch. The tour-
nament was very well orga-
nized. 

Students were divided into 
three teams of 12 each, and 
they played each other in a 
"Round Robin" format. A to- 
tal of six games were played The Chess Team competing at ICCS included, above Christian Luke 

before they broke for lunch Austin Miller, Jerad Nicolas, and Teresa Boles. Below, coaches Barbara 

and a much -needed break. In LaChance and George Feigle check Karleigh Reeves and Cash 

the afternoon, the winners of Krueger scores. SHCS photo 

Angela Schad named 
National Merit Finalist 

On Tuesday, May 22, the 
iacred Heart Catholic School 
SHCS) Chess Team, led by 
larbara LaChance, boarded 
1 bus and traveled eagerly to 
heir first chess tournament. 
he meet was held at Im-

naculate Conception Catho-
ic School (ICCS) in Denton. 
his was the first chess tour-

lament for both of the newly-
ormed teams, so the stu-
ents were both anxious and 

The kindergarten classes 
I Muenster ISD celebrated 

their graduation on Tuesday, 
May 22. The welcome was 
given by Rut Rodriguez and 
the invocation was given by 
Irish Brinkley. The pledges 
qvere led by Abby Zamzow, 
Dane Huchton, Parker 
lleGrew, and MacKenzie 

Angela Schad, Valley View 
resident and senior at Incar-
nate Word High School 
IWHS) in San Antonio, has 

been named a 2007 National 
Merit Finalist, school officials 
have announced. Angela is 
the daughter of Elaine and E. 
J. Schad of Valley View and 
the granddaughter of Louise 
Schad of Lindsay and Nancy 
Krahl of Valley View, and is 
the great-granddaughter of 
Ethel Kammerdiener of 
Gainesville. 

Angela joins a group that 
represents less than 1% of all 
U. S. high school graduating 
seniors to attain the National 
Merit Finalist distinction. 
She is eligible for one of about 
8,200 National Merit Schol-
arships to be named later. 

About 15,000 scholastically 
talented high school seniors 
are named National Merit 
Finalists annually based on 
their exceptional academic 
promise as determined by 
scores on their preliminary 
college-level entry testing, 
officials said. 

Angela attended Sacred 
Heart High School in Muen-
ster her freshman year, 
where she was a member of 
the dance team, played soft-
ball, and was involved in 
many other activites. 

Since transferring to 
IWHS, Angela has been in-
volved in many activities, in-
cluding, National Honor So-
ciety vice president, president 
of the IWHS Math and Sci-
ence Club, and is a member 
of the International Thespian 
Society. Angela has been in 
theater for three years, gar-
nering lead roles in her senior 
year, and she is a member of 
the University of Incarnate 
Word Community Orchestra 
where she plays the violin. 

Angela Schad 

Angela graduated May 20 
during ceremonies at Incar-
nate Word High School. The 
ceremony was attended by 
her father, E. J. Schad, and 
her brother, Ed Schad; of Los 
Angeles. Since her brother 
Tommy was graduating on 
the same day, her mother and 
sister were at Notre Dame! 
Angela plans to attend the 

University of Notre Dame in 
South Bend, Indiana, where 
she has been selected as a 
Notre Dame Scholar. She 
plans to major in chemistry. 

Medical tip 
Choose hospital advo-

cates. If you're staying in the 
hospital, line up your most 
outspoken friends and family 
to stay with you. Hospital 
care varies depending on the 
quantity and experience of 
staff, and you may not be able 
to monitor your own care . 
Don't worry; you'll be able to 
return the favor someday. 

Auensster Ailment 
in btstorp 

from the 
Muenster Historical Commission 

Muenster's first full time 
chief of police was Bill Pratt. 
Joyce Tucker Tempel was the 
first full time city secretary. 

The City purchased the 
clinic from the T.S. Myrick 
estate in 1981 for a library. 

Muenster's first city well 
was drilled in 1928. Water 
meters were first read in July 
1932. 

Sicking. The commencement 
address was given by Muen-
ster ISD senior and Student 
Council President Brad En-
dres. 

Kindergarten students en-
tertained those in attendance 
with what they wanted to be 
when .they grow up, songs, 
and even an animal dance. 

To conclude the graduation, 
the thank you was given by 
Nolan Bayer and the benedic-
tion by Kody Walterscheid. 

Members of the kindergar-
ten class include: Lane Bald-
win, Corbin Bayer, Nolan 
Bayer, Josh Brinkley, 
Brayden Burris, Hannah 
Clure, Noah Clure, Haley 

Frank, Brittany Green, 
Nathan Hacker, Allison Hen-
scheid, Dane Huchton, Ryan 
Huchton Kolby Klement, 
Chris Kresge, Cole Kubis, 
Derek Lutkenhaus, Parker 
McGrew, Bernardo Meza, 
Hayden Otto, Logan Pagel, 
Diego Rocha, Anthony 
Rodriguez, Rut Rodriguez, 
Sadie Sandmann, Rudy Sau-
cer, Mackenzie Sicking, Lau-
ren Trubenbach, Jaden 
Walterscheid, Kody Waltersc-
heid, Warren Williams, Kyle 
Wolf, and Abby Zamzow. 

Muenster ISD kindergar-
ten teachers are Danna Fre-
drick and Sharon Ledbetter. 

Lindsay Elementary School students were honored with Knighthood Royal Excellence Awards for the 
4th Six Weeks. These are students who show improvement, exhibit leadership skills, or demonstrate 
excellence in any school area. In addition to being honored on campus by having their names posted on 
building bulletin boards and the school web page, each student receives a coupon to CiCi's Pizza. They 
are, from left, back row - Elijah Walker, Freddy Shasteen, Mason Morrow, Chisam Reiter, Nicole Fleitman, 
Diane Gonzales, Jessica Laster, Shannah Daymude; middle row - Zach Mundt, Jacob Cler, Brenna Fleitman, 
Alaina Klement; front row - Sarah Corcoran. Preston Brewer, Karsyn Taylor, Colby Metzler. 

LISD photo 



Muenster High 
School 

Graduation 2007 
Above left, moving clockwise: 
Jordan Ledbetter, Brad Endres, 
and Melissa Cox view items taken 
out of a time capsule; Daniel 
Waneck, class sponsor, assists 
Bret Walterscheid in preparation 
for graduation. Collin 
Walterscheid watches; Sponsor 
Kristi. Schneider moves Kalyn 
Rohmer's tassel; Kayla Otto can't 
hide her emotions; and the 
traditional "hats". Inset - Chad 
Endres and Jose Velasquez 
celebrate after graduation. 

BYRON R. BERRY  
Attorney At Law - C.P.A. 

Bankruptcy 
FREE INITIAL 

CONSULTATION 

940.668.6171 

www.HBWVLAW.com  
209 W. California 

Gainesville, TX 76240 
Main Office 512 W. Hickory, Ste. 100 • Denton, TX 76210 

Not Certified by The Texas Board of Legal Specialization 

Hayes, Berry, White & Vanzant, LLP 

Muenster Memorial Hospital 

Rehabilitation Program 
Our Swing Bed Program provides Skilled Nursing 

Care and Rehabilitation Therapy that may benefit 

patients in the following areas: 

• Post - Acute IV Therapy 

• Post - Surgery Therapy for patients with 

an orthopedic surgical procedure requiring 

physical or occupational therapy 

• Post - Stroke Therapy 

• Pneumonia Recuperation 

• Heart Problems 
Our Physical Therapy Staff: I to r Cassie Kuykendall 
Physical Therapist; Mike hlattila Physical Therapist 
Assistant; Laura Hail Physical Therapist Assistant 

Therapists provide Occupational Therapy, Physical Therapy, and Speech Therapy 
Contact Adelia Wilson (940) 759-6162 

Wed11"7--  ' ngs 
Concerts 

Photography 
Thomas Otto 	 Sports 

940-634-0942 
http://tomauto.smugmug.com  

tomauto15@gnaail.com  

ongrats to the Graduating C lass  of 7007 

See Graduation pictures of: 
Muenster High School 

Sacred Heart High 
Sacred Heart 8th Promotion 

Sacred Heart Pre-School Promo. 

Please visit my website! All 4x6 Pictures 
sell for $2.75 and are printed then shipped 
to your door* (Shipping time varies 7-14d) 

Tomauto 
Portraits 

Zach Dostart, 24, grandson 
of Mary Sicking of Gaines-
ville, and nephew of Cliff and 
Kathy Sicking of Muenster, 
and of Myra residents Bryan 
Sicking and Bill Sicking. has 
received two graduate de-
grees from Pepperdine Uni-
versity in Malibu. California. 
Zach is the son of Paul 
Dostart and Joyce Sicking 
Dostart, of La Jolla, Califor-
nia. 

On April 14, Zach received 
his Masters of Business Ad-
ministration degree, with a 
concentration in Finance, 
from Pepperdine's Graziadio 
Graduate School of Business 
and Management. Zach re-
ceived the Juris Doctor de-
gree from Pepperdine's 
School of Law on May 18. 
Both ceremonies were at-
tended by Zach's parents, his 
younger brother Sam, and 
many friends. 

While in law school, Zach 
was elected managing editor 

of the Pepperdine Law Re-
view, and he represented 
Pepperdine on its traveling 
moot court team. 

Simmonds solicitors (law 
firm) in London, England 
2004), the US Securities and 
Exchange Commission, Divi- 
sions of Corporate Finance 
and Enforcement, in Wash- 
ington, DC (2005), and Mor- 
gan Stanley investment bank 
in New York City (2006). 

During Spring Semester 
2006, Zach served with the 
United States District Court 
in Los Angeles, where he was 
a law clerk for the senior 
judge of the nation's largest 
federal trial court. 

This August, Zach will re-
locate to New York City 
where he has accepted a po-
sition with Lehman Brothers, 
a large investment bank. He 
will work in the Global Real 
Estate Group of Lehman's 
Capital Markets Division. 
Before moving from Califor-
nia to New York, Zach will 
complete the CPA exam, and 
sit for the California Bar 
Exam. 

Sicking grandson earns his 
Masters and Doctors degrees 

Lindsay Elementary School honored students with Knighthood Royal Excellence Awards for the Sth Six 
Weeks. These are students who show improvement, exhibit leadership skills, or demonstrate excellence 
in any school area. In addition to being honored on campus by having their names posted on building 
bulletin boards and the school web page, each student receives a coupon to CiCi's Pizza. Recipients 
were, from left, back row - Brad Bezner, Rachel Fuhrmann, Blake Walker, Dylan Hughes, Garrett 
Cooper, Shea Garner, Travis Krahl; middle row - AS Anzaldua, Emily Otto, Molly Myrick, Rider Mendeke, 
Logan King; front row - Olivia Hertel, Parker Jones, Slade DeHoyos, Kyle Ott, Merrick Parkhill. 

LISD photo 

JUVENILE 	 cont. from pg. I LANDLORDS 
SHOULD 

Anything but simple be-
coming a Landlord 

Whether you hope to be-
come a land baron or simply 
to raise a little extra cash by 
renting out the in-law apart-
ment in your basement, rent-
ing property is a lot trickier 
than it looks. If you decide to 
do it, take some precau-
tions... 

Do the legwork. Always 
check applicants' credit his-
tory, references, and back-
ground, even if you 'have a 
good feeling' about .  them. 
Haphazard screening often 
results in problem tenants 
who don't pay rent, trash 
your place, move in undesir-
able friends, or worse.Anther 
bad result? Lower property 
value. 

for the Texas Local Govern-
ment Investment Pool. 
Brennan replaces Jane Alex-
ander. 

• Moved dates of Depart-
mental Budget hearings from 
June 25 to June 18 and 19. 

• Accepted the North Cen-
tral Texas Trauma Regional 
Advisory Council's allotment 
of funds to Cooke County. 
Money is from tickets written 
in State and will be used by 
EMS. 

• Opened only bid received 
for replacing heating and air 
conditioning for the County 
Library. Culpepper was 
awarded the bid for $16,225. 

• Opened sole bid on six 
used fuel tanks being sold 
individually by Precinct #1. 
Ken Case bid $101 each for 
the two small 500 gallon  

tanks. There were no bids on 
the other four tanks. Case's 
bid was accepted. 

• Approved the final plat 
for Butler Subdivision No. 3 
(lots 1-2) located off of CR 321 
and CR 336 in Precinct #3. 

• Approved the prelimi-
nary plat for The Villas at 
Lake Kiowa (lots 1-10), lo-
cated off of FM 902 in Pre-
cinct #2. Will be a gated com-
munity for those 55 plus and 
also is the County's first 
townhomes. 

• Approved jailer bond for  

Precinct #1 for the times 
when prisoners are used to 
work in the Precinct. 

• Approved Sheriff's Office . 
bonds for deputy sheriffs 
James Willingham, J.E. Ar 
cher, and Nolan Hicks, jailer. 

filuenSter ilioment 
in bistorp 

from the 

Muenster Historical Commission 

Great Vision! Great L_cpc)1<! Great \falues! 

we accept all tltx,as 	
"Ile, Lan not lx, 	 , 1 ■ 11 any 

other coupons. discounts. insurance or sales. Some restrictions apply. 

Dr. John Webb 0.0. 
Therapeutic Optometrist 

Full Surface Lab 
1-2 Hour Service 
Plastic Lens Only 

• Eye Exams 
• Contact Lens 
• Fashion Frames 

Contact Lens Exams 
$75 to $100 

1  FREE  trail pair (disposals Lens and follow up visit included) 

311 East California St. (940) 668-7254 • 1-888-237-0756 • Open M-F 9am - 5:30pm • Sat 9am - 1pm 



Linbsam Grabuation 

Waiting to "walk" include Lindsay seniors, from top - Amanda 
Hess and Jill Benner, Emily Haverkamp and Johnathan Zimmerer; 
and Sanaa Anwar and Chandni Patel. 	Scott Wood photos 

MG lars7  

COW POKES 
	

By Ace Reid 

Now here is a nice little ole' pony that's classy 

and don't eat much?" 

If you're ready to TRADE-UP into a new 
truck, see us FIRST. Get a "PRE- 

ARRANGED" loan then make a BETTER 
"CASH" deal for the vehicle of your choice . 

FIRST 
NATIONAL 
BANK 

of Saint Jo (940) 995-2556 Saint Jo, Texas 

Muenster Branch (940) 759-2218 Muenster, Texas 
ryg 	'Vail JApplecaale Vus liffittide 

Weird Medical Fact... 
Sofas or couches injured over 135,000 
people in 2002 badly enough to seek medi-
cal attention! Skateboards sent only 
113,000 people to the doctor. 

(20a1lace 10.91.44 
1002 Pecan 

Lindsay, Tx. 76250 

914.441-cial Sewiee,2 s usee  1969  j 

!Muenster Farm Mutual' 
Fire Insurance Association 

41- 212 N. Walnut 	 Muenster, Texas * 
ill P.O. Box 612 	 940-759-4770 .

'1%.. 	 ,..41 
 "'"*.10000411..00000•111/^ 

4.4■••••••••■•• ••••••■•••••■41, 
tt 	

41
* For Good. Low Cost 

I 

• 

FIRE and STORM INSURANCE 
Contact 

Want faster speed for your 
Internet service? 

Call Nortex for a 
Broadband 

Connection! 

Includes: 
• FREE Installation 
• FREE Virus Protection 

FREE Spam Filtering 
• $75 DSL Modem 
• Faster Downloads 
• Always-on Connection 

• Local company 

Only $39.95* 
per month 

759-2251 www.nortex.com  

non. speed. a, DIAtile S39.9 ,  refer,  ti ,  1 \ la s lx4 I qinnmani And lanes are additional 

PROVIDING QUALITY HEALTH CARE 

To PATIENTS OF ALL AGES 
Los G. ADVINCLIA, M.D., FA.C.P. 	HEWES, D.O., F.LC.S. 

BOARD Cerium 	 BOARD CERTIHED 

INFERNAL MEDICINE 	 GENERAL SURGEON 

NIELItsissa BEAM, H, ENP-C Yvowe AhIBROSE, FNP-C, ACNP-C Teie 7,01-e0Mie 
BOARD CERTIFIED 	 BOARD Corrinco 

FAMILY Ni-sw PRA(-rmoimi 	EMMY NURSE PRACTMOVER 	MEDICARE, MEDICAID, AND Most I 'Ai sCRANCES ACCEPTED 

509 NORTH MAPLE • MUENSTER • (940) 759-2226 

Caleett  

MMH FAMILY 
HEALTH 
CLINIC 

Extended 
Clinic Hours 

MONDAY - FRIDAY, 8AM - 5PM 
SATURDAY, 8AM - NOON 

ing 200 points twice, the only 
two times in UIL history, first 
time State champion girls' 
basketball and track teams, 
first time State tennis and 
golf competitors, and a first 
time girls powerlifting cham-
pion, all in one year," she re-
marked. "These are incred-
ible achievements, and they 
sort of give us the right to say 
'betcha can't do it like us', 
because these past years, 
this last one especially, have 
been truly amazing." 

Dr. Jason Ceyanes, super-
intendent, presented the 
Davelyn Neidhardt Award to 
Craig Hertel. Rachel Zim-
merer nominated him with 
her essay. 

Class awards and scholar-
ships were then presented by 
Dr. Ceyanes and Principal 
Phillip Hall as follows: 

Brittany Anderle - Govern-
ment, Tommi Sue Meurer 
Endowment Scholarship, 
Basketball Scholarship to 
TWU, TWU Honors Scholar-
ship, TWU New Student 
Scholarship; 

Sanaa Anwar - Art Class 
Award, Dean's ScholarAward 
from Austin College; 

Jillian Bezner - 'Knights of 
Columbus Lee Assembly Pa-
triotism Scholarship, FCCLA 
Scholarship; 

Meredith Bezner - Mary 
Josephine Cox Scholarship 
from NCTC (MJC), Poly Pipe 
NCTC Scholarship; 

Allison Copeland - Army 
ROTC Scholarship; 

Christopher Dieter - Boys 
and Girls Club of Cooke 
County Scholarship, Lindsay 

Great preparations have 
been made for the Sesquicen-
tennial in Forestburg. It will 
be celebrated on June 8, 9, 
and 10. 

Friday night, the crowning 
of Mr. and Ms. Forestburg, 
and a beard and mustache 
contest will take place. After-
wards, you can dance under 
the stars at the street dance. 
Those who know, say that 
Bonnie and Clyde will be at-
tending. They plan to show 
everyone their dancing skills 
at the dance. Supper will also 
be available, so bring your 
appetite. 

OnSaturday, there will be 
a kids parade, regular pa-
rade, and tree dedication. 
Following those events, the 
Forestburg Volunteer Fire 
Department is preparing a 
fish fry with French fries, cole 
slaw, hush puppies, and all 
the trimmings to be served at 
noon. Bonnie and Clyde plan 
to listen to the bands that are 
going to play from around 1 
p.m. to 6 p.m. There will be a 
fiddlers contest included. 

Other fun includes souve-
nirs of all kinds to celebrate 
Forestburg's birthday, a cov-
ered wagon and a chuck 
wagon serving beans and cole 
slaw, kids games, horseshoes 
or washers, and 42 playing. 
There will be an Antique 
Style Show, food contest, and 
quilt show. Sesquicentennial 
books are available. 

On Sunday, music begins at 
10 a.m. with a Worship Ser-
vice starting at 11 a.m. 
Bonnie is going to sing 
"Amazing Grace." A pot luck 
lunch will be served around 
noon, so bring your favorite 
dish. In the afternoon 

Catholic Life Scholarship; 
Julie Hanson - Accounting 

2 Class Award. Class of 2006 
Scholarship; 

Levi Hermes - PTC Schol-
arship, Texas Tech Honors 
Endowed Scholarship; 

Amanda Hess - AP Calcu-
lus, Economics Class Awards; 

Kaileigh Hess - National 
Merit Scholarship from Texas 
Tech University: 

Autumn Murrill - Wal-
Mart Community Scholar-
ship, Superior Scholastic 
Achievement Scholarship: 

Dustin Neu - Knights of 
Columbus Scholarship: 

Amy Nortman - Annual 
Staff Class Award, February 
Soroptomist Girl of the 
Month Award; 

Joseph Otto - AP Biology 
and Spanish 3 Class Awards, 
Tennis Scholarship at Merid-
ian Community College, 
Patrick R. Harris Memorial 
Scholarship, Chicken Ex- 
press Scholarship, Pauline 
Pace NCTC Scholarship, 
MJC Scholarship; 

Chandni Patel - Salutato-
rian, SMU Distinguished 
Scholars Scholarship; 

Karissa Reiter - Texas 
State Achievement Scholar-
ship, Texas State Lone Star 
Scholarship, Texas Tech Hon-
ors Endowed Scholarship, UT 
Arlington Outstanding 
Freshman Scholarship, UT 
Dallas Academic Excellence 
Scholarship, Fort Worth Scot-
tish Rite Scholarship; 

Jennifer Schroeder -
Knights of Columbus Schol-
arship, Catholic Life Insur-
ance All American Award, 

Grandpa's Neighbors will 
play and sing at 1 p.m., with 
a little britches rodeo also 
starting at 1 p.m. Children 
ages five to 10 can enter stick 
bull riding, stick barrel rac-
ing, and a calf scramble. 
There will also be a woman's 
calf scramble. The BB gun 
shoot-out will award a BB 
gun to the first place finisher. 

It's going to be a grand ole 
time, so make plans to attend. 
Visit the website 
forestburgtx.com . 

North Texas Medical Center 
Auxiliary Scholarship, Rob-
ert and Frances Farmer 
NCTC Scholarship, MJC 
Scholarship; 

Victoria Vogel - English 4 
Class Award, Intel NCTC 
Scholarship, MJC Scholar-
ship; 

Johnathan Zimmerer - Na-
tional Rifle Association Out-
standing Youth Achievement 
Award, Randall Paclic Memo-
rial Scholarship, Extension 
Education Scholarship, Na-
tional Turkey Federation 
Scholarship, FFA Ford Schol-
arship, Catholic Life All 
American Scholarship, Ten-
nessee Tech Athletic Scholar-
ship, Best Buy Scholarship, 
Knights of Columbus Lee 
Wolf Assembly Patriotism 
Scholarship, Keep Texas 
Beautiful Ruthie Jackson 
Youth Leadership Award, 
Daughters of the American 
Revolution Essay Contest 
Award; 

Laura Zimmerer -Account-
ing 1 and AP English 4 Class 
Awards, Outstanding Stu-
dent, Lechner Scholarship, 
VFW Voice of Democracy Es-
say Contest Scholarship, Ed-
win A. Smith Endowed Op-
portunity Award, Terry Foun-
dation Scholarship, Fort 
Worth Scottish Rite Scholar-
ship, Nortex Communica-
tions Gene H. Fuhrman 
Scholarship, NASCOGA Fed-
eral Credit Union Scholar-
ship, Valedictorian; 

Rachel Zimmerer - VFW 
Voice of Democracy Essay 
Contest Scholarship, Texas 
A&M Foundation Scholar-
ship, Mary James Burns 
Scholarship, Wal-Mart Schol-
arship, Lone Star Landbank 
Scholarship, Dell Scholars 
Award, UT Department of 
Theater and Dance Award, 
Terry Foundation Scholar-
ship, NASCOGA Federal 
Credit Union Scholarship. 

Carol Luttmer introduced 
Valedictorian Laura Zim-
merer. Laura recalled their 
class as timid freshmen who 
would barely cheer at pep ral- 

	cont. from pg. I 
lies and compared them to 
the now self-confident seniors 
into which they had grown. 

Laura said, "Every one of 
us has endured our own per-
sonal struggles. We have 
cried over boyfriends or girl-
friends, fought unmercifully 
with our parents, debated 
over which college to attend. 
and sunk into the depths of 
severe senioritis. Separately 
we have survived the tedious 
life that is high school. To-
gether, however, as a class we 
have managed to attain a 
level of excellence unsur-
passed by any other. As if the 
State Basketball, Track, One 
Act Play, and UIL Academic 
championships weren't 
enough to prove this, how 
many other classes have stu-
dents that even though they 
have a grade of 98.5, they 
still aren't in the top 10% of 
the class." 

The class was described by 
Laura as having, "kind, am-
bitious, competitive, eager. 
and energetic qualities that 
set them apart as a group 
with irrepressible spirit." 

Laura thanked people who 
had helped her in high school, 
including some of her teach-
ers. "These teachers drove me 
to countless UIL meets, prac-
ticed with me for hours after 
school, and provided priceless 
laughs and memories along 
the way." One thing she 
learned, "relax and take life 
as it comes, don't worry about 
stressing out about every 
little detail, just have fun do-
ing what you love to do." 

The graduates then recog-
nized their parents. Principal 
Hall presented the senior 
class and Dr. Ceyanes certi-
fied them. 

Diplomas were awarded to 
the graduates by Lloyd Re-
iter, LISD Board president. 
with assistance from Cey-
anes, Hall, Linus Fuhrrnann, 
Robin Hess, and Carol Lutt-
mer. 

Rachel Zimmerer, class 
president, gave the closing re-
marks. 
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LISD GRADS 

Forestburg readies 
for Sesquicentennial 
celebration June 8-10 



Sacred Heart 
Alumni & Friends 
4 Man Scramble 

Shot Gun Start @ 2 pm 

P§.1  
109  SN 

3‘314V' 	40Ar 

0°  bit Q4'ST 

CpAVV11' 	Ct 117  
-0,sz,s2,  

0  GREEN FEE, 4' p4  
MULLIGAN, CART, 
SNACKS, DRINKS FOR INFO: 

INCLUDED: 	TERRY HESS 	4 0 7 

19  '0: t\5:3  1111. 6 2 5 6  
..m■wilMa 

& MEAL 	
RHONDA HARTMAN 

$65." 
per 

person 
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Sntalosperkeo 	 Insurance Agency 

Aultt . Ittmt 	 • l'ontInt,r‘ 	 940-759-4571 

Dear Parents, Parishioners, Alumni, and Friends of Sacred Heart 
Catholic School, 
The Sacred Heart Catholic School Senior Class would like to 
thank all of the people who have given of their time, talent, and 
treasure to ensure our great education. Thanks to the contribution 
of peoples' time, our school now enjoys newer technology, a 
more inviting appearance, and improved facilities. These people 
who give their time to our school deserve more thanks than we 
could ever give, but we want to assure them that their gifts are 
fully appreciated. Many thanks also go out to those who have 
given of their talent. We are lucky to have a wide variety of 
highly skilled alumni, parents, and friends who give back to the , 

school. Without you, we would not be able to, make any 
advancement whatsoever. Another generous gift we are very 
appreciative of is the gift of treasure. Thanks to the charitable 
donations of so many, our school has mode the transition into 
the new era with new technologies, curriculum, and facilities. The 
detail most often overlooked is that without each other, each one 
of these gifts is nearly useless; but when all three are present, 
the result is something we can all be proud of. The Senior Class 
is proud to say thank you to all those who have supported us in 
our educational journey. 

Thank you, 
The Sacred Heart Catholic School Senior Class of 2007 

Muenster Jaycees 20th Annual 

Ruth Hess Memorial 
Golf Tournament 
Saturday, July 7 

at 2:00 pm 

$260 per team. 
Entry fee includes green fees, cart, 

t-shirt & meal following end of round 

Prizes in 4 flights 

Call Brian Herr for more info at 
759-4512/2376 or 736-8238. 

wig 75' Netierkink Garden Hose 
Guaranteed! • 	.. 	tangle. 
Features Miconn eld 	, t-icoon against 
mold and fnlclew. Lifetime warranty. 

L 784 678 83 ...supplies Last. 

JUNE 

REMINGTON 

19" 
12" Electric String Trimmer 
3-n -onto nwlor, 180-degree 
rotating handle, telescoping 
shaft and an edging guide 
wheel. T 704 116 1 
wane sm. an 

16" Oscillating Stand Fan 
rn , 	a ■ , ,tary dial 

speed Control, adjustable 

of the month tin head and hatght 
settings. W 250 969 
Mirk supplies lest 

Holmes 

1499  

COMMUNITY LUMBER COMPANY 

HIGHWAY 82 • MUENSTER 7Wie aeae 
759-2248 	START RIGHT. START HERE. 

DRY CLEAN  
SUPER CENTER 

1001 E. California St. • Gainesville, TX 76240 

940-665-0048 
IS UNDER NEW OWNERSHIP!!! 

1 FREE 
With each same garment paid for. 

Must present this ad when dropping off your order. 
Valid thru 6/8/07. 

The Best Service at the Best Price! 
• Expert Alterations • Hand Fin shed Silks 

• Wedding Gown Heirloommg/Preservation • Leather Cleaning 

Hours: 
Mon.. Fri. lam • 7pm 
Saturday 9am - 2pm 

Dry Cleaning 
(Sort garments some enepltons appl, 

$299  

Comforters & 
Bedspreads 

$ 17
99  

Jeans Laundered 
& Starched 

$309 

Shirts Laundered 
& Starched 

$ 1 19  

REOPENING 

The following are excerpts 
from recent Texas Parks and 
Wildlife Department law en-
forcement reports. 

Speeding citation only 
skimmed surface — April 
19, a Freestone County game 
warden stopped a reckless 
driver who had been issued a 
speeding ticket by a state 
trooper less than 20 minutes 
prior. The subject was ar-
rested for driving with a sus-
pended license, possession of 
methamphetamine, and reck-
less driving. When the war-
den asked why his truck was 
in such bad shape, the driver 
said he had intentionally run 
over four deer because his 
friends needed the meat. 

Later, the individual gave 
a videotaped statement about 
two of the four deer and im-
plicated two other people. 
Apparently unaware of the 
consequences, the arrested 
subject also made a state-
ment to the jailer about 
throwing a bag of marijuana 
out the window before he was 
stopped. Sure enough, when 
the warden returned to the 
scene, he found the ditched 
bag of marijuana. An addi-
tional felony charge of tam-
pering with evidence was 
filed. The investigation re-
garding the dead deer contin-
ues. 

Warden 	prompts 
lawyer's backpedal — A 
Kimble County game war-
den, continuing an open in-
vestigation on two suspects 
involved in harvesting an 
axis deer and two black buck 
antelopes without landowner 
consent, interviewed the 
younger of the two suspects 
via telephone in mid April. 
Shortly thereafter, the older 
suspect (who happened to be 
an attorney and soon-to-be 
father-in-law of the younger 
suspect) called the warden. 

The attorney/suspect ac- 

cused the warden of viola-
tions of attorney-client privi-
lege and playing favorites, 
but the warden wasn't hav-
ing it. He explained to the 
lawyer that intimidation tac-
tics would not be tolerated 
and would not have any in-
fluence on the investigation. 
Consequently, the attorney 
quickly changed his tune and 
said they would be willing to 
make restitution on the ani-
mals. 

Warden gets play-by-
play cell-phone S.O.S — 
On April 14, a Matagorda 
County game warden re-
ceived a call from an indi-
vidual who said a female 
friend of his and a teenage 
boy had called him because 
they were stuck in Matagorda 
Bay. While the warden was 
en route, the individual called 
back to let him know the 
stranded motorists were tak-
ing on water. A few minutes 

later he called again because 
they were sinking. He then 
called once more to say that 
they were capsized and hang-
ing on to the keel. A rescue 
was made and no one was in-
jured. 

Pyros or Insurance 
Fraud? —At approximately 
1:00 a.m. on April 12, a Mont-
gomery County game warden 
was patrolling near the San 
Jacinto River and the Spring 
Creek area where he ob-
served two vehicles pull onto 
an isolated, dead-end lane. 
The warden followed, and af-
ter observing for a bit of time, 
one automobile suddenly 
burst into flames. The light 
from the fire made the war-
den visible, and the subjects 
quickly fled. The warden pur-
sued and stopped the vehicle, 
got the driver out, and kept 
the other passengers at gun-
point until backup officers 
arrived. Investigation into 

the burning vehicle is ongo-
ing. 

Reckless recreation en-
dangers neighbor — A 
Schleicher County game war-
den responded to a call from 
a shaken individual who 
stated that his vehicle and 
house had been shot. The 
warden visited the caller's 
residence and then proceeded 
to the property in the general 
direction from where the 
shots had come. There, he 
encountered two men and a 
woman. They admitted to 
shooting in the general direc-
tion of the complainant's 
house, which was clearly vis-
ible, but stated they did not 
think the bullets would travel 
that far. They had also shot 
numerous holes into a nearby 
vacant house. The warden 
picked up 179 empty 9mm 
shell casings and counted 79 
holes in the wall of the vacant 
house. 

 	 SPORTS  

  

 

Muenster 
Hornet Band 

Colorguard 

Car Wash 
Saturday, June 2 

9 a.m.- 2 p.m. 

at the Sonic 
Pli4e a. dough 
Try not to become a person 

of success, but rather a per-
son of value 

The Montague 4-H Shotgun Club competed at the District 3 4-H Trap Shoot May 19 with 155 other 
Texhorna shooters. Members are, from left, back - Brantlyn Teague, Caleb Schlomach, Cole Erickson, 
Eli Shaw, Tyler Coates; front - Joyce Fenoglio. Rylee Foust, Hunter Allison. Colton Brown, and Ron 
Foust. The team is preparing for their next competition in Waco in June. 

 

****************** ** 
•Muenster State Bank  
,* 84th Anniversary * * - Hot bog Party • * 
* ,1 41'1561  \ June 8th 
* tko.... 	11 :30ani * 
* 11,  gm  to 1.:00pm * 
* * * Customer * * * 
*Appreciation* 

Cookout 
* In front of the Bank * ** mir* Muenster * 
* 	State Bank *  * 
* 0,-  

fwAte a. awful/a 
When you make a decision, 

use your head as well as your 
heart. 

others, instead, look for Love. 

Get low prices on 
quality top-name products 

201 N Main, Muenster, 940-759-2257 
FDK 

******************** 

TeleBank 759-2000 

TEXAS GAME WARDEN FIELD  REPORTS 



NTERPRISE 
CLASSIFIED ADS 

CLASSIFIED 
RATES 

First 20 words 
$5.00 - 25c per 
word after that 
Card of Thanks 

$8.00 

E MUENSTER 	WHEN YOU NEED TO BUY, SELL, HIRE ... 

OR 

FAX 759-4110 
DEADLINE 

TUESDAY 5PM 

Bridal Registry 
Lauren Matlock & 
Christopher York 

•—oilion•Ce-• 

Ch LSI 

de Welly & 
111.I. trio 	 Hamm, 

759-2994 

HELP WANTED 

The Critter 

Erstzturniat 

Daytime kitchen 
help needed. 

Please apply in person. 

Part-time position 
available in well 

established 
insurance agency 

in Gainesville. 
Send resume to '2 

BOX 430 
Gainesville, TX 76241 

First National Bank of 
Saint Jo has an opening 
for a teller trainee for it_ 
Muenster Branch 
Banking experience a 
plus. Send resume to P.O 
Box B. Saint Jo. TX 7626o 

STITCHERS NEEDED: 
Nocona Athletic Goods 
Company 	needs 
experienced 	sewing 
machine operators for the 
position of baseball glove 
stitcher. Applicants must 
have prior experience 
working on flatbed sewing 
machines, with leather 
experience a plus. 
Full benefits available. 
Please apply in person at 
901 E. Hwy 82, Nocona. 
TX in the old Nocona Boot 
Company Building. 

HELP WANTED 
Walterscheid Meat Co. 

is 

 

seeking 

a Clean-up Person 
& a Meat Packager 

Smile!! 
• 

SERVICES 

Gehrig's 
Bndal Registry 

Kristen Yosten 
& John Roller 

Amber Wolf 
& Joe Jones 

210 N. Main Muenster 

759-4112 

Department of State Health Services 
Parent Must Be Present: • Sliding Fee Scale 

Bring Shot Record.' 

(c June 6. 2007 WFD,ND  

r 9:00 	to 1100  

Cooke Co. Elec. Co-oo  
E. Hi,. (.2, SI uen.te r, TX 910-865-6397  

v RE/MAX First Realty iv  

FABULOUS FIND! 
Everything you need in this 3 br. home. C 1.1-10M 

cabinets, hardwood floors, central vacuum indoor 
storm shelter, wrap around porch, Geo-thermal 
heat/cool. 24 x 32 insulated shop. Not a drive by . 

Must See! Call Rita at 736-8061. 

For photos 6 donation CC Mese & other gawk; go ix 

Rita Greer, AM, CRS 
BROM, 50, 1,1ATE 

EvEgr IN DIE Lock MArazr 
wrn-i acek SeEv1s,F1 

940-736-8061 
RFJ4AX_COM 

Serving Cooke Wise. Denton & Montague C 

aM 

Muenster State Bank 
rimpiint is Rimy a, LaWS horng oirt 

Corvtruction laram. Home Loan. & Home Equity loans 
WE ALSO SLAKE longterm Fixed-Raw Mortgage. 

Lott 
	 940-759-2257 

FIRST NATIONAL 
BANK of Saint Jo 

Muenster Branch 
For your Land Loans, Home Loans, 

Construction Loans or Home Equity Loans. 

See us at 519 E. DIVISION ST 

OUR PRODUCTS ARE ALL FIXED RATE 
WITH LOW CLOSING COSTS. 

You will appreciate our attitude. 

940.759.2218 

REAL ESTATE 

NORTE TEXAS "5 
 PROPERTIES 

NEW LISTINGS  - 7 Residential building 
locations in Muenster with Dry water and sew, 

an place. Each ick n approvmmely 0.51  acre. Located 

on east side of Mesquite Street Deed restricted to 

protect owners oterests ONLY $16.000 each. 

commercial Building  - 011 the historic 
"Square^ in Saint to - Great Bukness 

opportunity. Completely remodeled. ups., 

and down. move in ready. Krtchenette and 

bah room upscurs Many possrbrhoes ONLY 
$75,000 OR Lease lower level for $400 per 

month or upper level for $350 per month. 

5 minuses west of Muenster - S aces trams 
of Pnd en Muenster LSD deed restricted to trocect 
owners inter.. Each lot backs up to creek 

GREAT building site, ONLY $30,000 each. 
ONLY THREE LOTS LEFT. Five already sold. • 
Pictures, mops and details on our trebsitee 

www.northtexasproperties.com  
Jack Schoppa, Broker 940-995-2987 

..11111.414:IIIIIIR 1101111111,- 
HOME FOR SALE 

634 E. Eddy St. ' Muenster 
312/2 Brick Home on Large Lot 

2452 total sq. ft. 
Steve Trubenbach (940) 736-3239 

REDUCED $250 PER ACRE 
32 acres. Cooke County 
Road 121. Timber Creek, 
old dairy barn, fenced, 
some woods, $3,750 per 
acre, Carroll Real Estate. 
903-868-3154. 
	 4,27.61,  

MONSTER MOBILE HOMES 
Rent Properties Available. 

Call 759-2248 

LOTS FOR SALE 
Full city utilities on North 
Mesquite. Muenster. Half 
acre tracts. Deed 
restrictions. Priced to sell. 
Call 736-4100. 
	  135-35, 

HOUSE FOR SALE 
1 1, 232 South 

Sycamore. 759-4475. 940- 
229-1567 

a Circa: ll'eckp. 

HOME FOR SALE 
IN TOWN - 

1004 N. Sn / Caner lot 
3/2/2 Faxed / Covered Pow 

Goll not & strop shed, kbal 
renNierflood. Wok to sands 

dudes. Open am pion, 
edemas ocnigenoroe Ethan 

Call to see: 759-4021 

LOT FOR SALE 
South Willow Street 
(behind the park). Cal 
736-5884 or 727-8133 
leave a messare 

HOUSE Fl /t It F. \ 

123 N Oak. 
and ask for F. 

HEALTH 

HOME FURNISHINGS 

MATTRESS SALE 
_Adjustable 

Beds 
with Latex., - 
Mattress 

SPARE ROOM MATTRESS SETS STARTING AT 

s9995 	s12995  Qoaev 8188 95  

SLEEP MASTER 
Open M-F 9-6 & Sat 9-5 

	

940-612 - BEDS 	 427 N. Grand Ate. 

	

2 337 	 in Gainesville 

PUBLIC NOTICES 

47‘ 

Classified Deadline 
is 5pm Tues. 

AUCTIONS 

Mark Your Calendars! 
Three Estate Auctions in June 

Nes is conducting three wonderful auction events  in  Gainesville during June IN, 

not mtm these opportunities to purchase a new home or bin great collectible,. 
antiques. & furniture. NPS is the home of International Champion Auctioneer 
Renee Jones. CM CES BAS. North Texas" Only Certified Estate Specialist & 

Appraiser. Bring a chair A spend your Saturday with us! 

Auction # 1 
June 9." at 10:00 a.m. 

121 East -Jennie • Gainesville, IX 
Estate of Buck Jirasek 

Real Estate • Antiques • Collectibles • Tools • Sterling Flatware • Cotna • Jewelry 
laggeenow e.a 41, d wde or by Appaatess. Cueine Terms • Coodalaaces axecanc•d 47 of ..aria ever. 

* 940-668-7268 • 940-736-3448 * 
FEDERALLY INSPECTED 

11 
5 l, 

AUTOMOTIVE  

OTTO 
DOZER SERVICE 

Mike Otto 

665-2258 
Mobile 736-5333 

ROEBIC 
(-Ant 	Septic 

Liquefier 

T efokenr  

Community Lumber Co. 
205 E Oresen - Illarese.7542243 

OVER 60 USED 
CARS AND TRUCKS 
available all the time at 

Holiday Chevrolet in 
Whitesboro. 668-8152 or 

(903) 564-3551. 
110a 

Classified 

Deadline 

is 5pm 

Tuesday 

Invest in Catholic Education 

Support the Sacred Heart School Trust Fund 

A menwrial -gift will earn income for 
Catholic education in memory of the donor. 

An annuity gift wilt earn interest for the donor or 
designate for the rest of their fife after which the gift 
wilt be used for Catholic education. 

A donation to the Sacred Heart School-  Trust Fund 
Lc an investment in Catholic education. 

Sacred Heart Parish 
714 North Main 	 Muenster, Texas 76252 

•-tet ion #.2 
.June 23^' at 10:00 a.m. 

10 Shadowood • Gainesville, TX 
Estate of Francis Stobaugh 

Real Estate • Pontiac Surefire • Antiques • Collectible, • Tools • Carvings 

Aiuction #3  

-June 30'. at 10:00 a.m. 
610 W. Broadway • Gainesville, TX 
Several Living and General Estates 

Tools • Equipment • Primitives • Coins • Furniture • Antiques • Collectibles 
tisace.e. • u 0.,d sale wtr, ay, start., (...sepiete Tenn, • Cauca annowanni Sr  of •uctsoe event 

National Property Solutions, Inc. 
Renee Jones, CM CES BAS 99270 

Nora Teske Only Fended taste *sulk & Appraise. Temp & letentatioeal Champion Arnow, 

For Auction Info: Call 940-665-1898 
Real E.aate 9AI in Ceogeraibon with Cuter Beak, Na Ranee,- Pn-noun, on Real Estate . 

KY. &nee. Renw. arl all Personal Proprn, 

arivar-NPSolutions.cont 

Local Telephone 
Cable TV 

(------Xelpimmeggegf Long Distance 
Internet 
Wireless Service 

Nortex 

PRESTIGE PORTABLES 
PORTABLE TOILET RENTALS 

H & H 
	• 

VACUUM SERVICE • SEPTIC TANK CLEANING 

HESSE-SCHNIEDERJAN 
HEATINI, ((ND AIR CONDITIONINIC 

TRAM . 
	• We serriee Ise!! makes 

acid 
• 100ri customer satisfaction 

77(14-27S7 
	

wu-w.h.trane_com 

B.P.R.S. ELECTRICAL 
Residential - Commerc al - Remodel 

New Construction - Industrial 
24 Hour Emergent Service 

Licensed & Insured 
940-759-2486 - Cell 940-393-5473 

AGRICULTURAL  
PAUL J. HESS - NO. 1 
Kansas Alfalfa hay for 
sale. Any amount_ 

665-7601 or 665-9228. 
	  11 - T 

LAWN APO GARDEN 

Complete Lawn Care 

T27-5307 

Unlimited 
Long Distance from: 

11111G730.,  
With Choice Unlimited Package, 
you get: 

• 2 phone lines, choice of calling, 
features and unlimited long distance. 

• Plus discounts on other 
services like DSL and voice mail 
For only S69.50 per month.• 

'Some restrictions apply. Call for 

Call 759-2251 or www.nortex.com 	details. Does not include taxes. 

Talk as long as you want 
for one low monthly price! 
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759-4311 

AVON: 
To buy or sell Avon, 
call Evelyn Sicking, 

759-4388. 
	 31 

FOR HOME DEM= OF 
Fort Worth Star Telegram 
Call DALE WHITE, 

940-668-2743 
in 

FOR SALE 
2002 Ford F-350 super 
duty. 

 
new cab. long bed. V-

30. 4-wheel drive, 
automatic. Lariat. $15.000 
0130 ask for John. 759 
225 -  
- 	 • — 

iR SA I I 

0202. 

FOR SALE 

6 ( 
su, 	 "(1-4-;" 

7  FOR SALE: 
Jerk, Industrial Co sew 
Machine, $200. Call 9, 
390-4706. 

. FOR SALE 
1986 Chevy 1 ton 4X4, 
Flatbed w•12K winch. 
$4500. Call 940-3904706. 

115.S 

FOR RENT  

Storage Units 
For Rent 

7361041or 736-5434 

For Sale or Rent: 
40 Ft Storage Container. 
Call Paul or Gary H,s.s. 	ay. 

665-7601. 
	

GARAGE SALES 65-7601.  

Mini Storage MYRA BAPTIST CHURCH 
GARAGE SALE 
& BAKE SALE 

Schilling Fina 	Sat., Jane 9", 8:00  -  ? 

Ohl fad Oro liens 759-2522 or 
Frain Can robs fr• W We 759-2836  

NOTICE 01 PI BLIC MEETING 

The Texas Departmer.• 	• Ansportation IT:DOTI will 
conduct a public meet., Sro the purpose of soliciting 
public comments on the proposed improvements to 
Interstate Highway 1IH1 35 from the Denton County 
line to the Red River in Cooke County. Texas. The 
proposed project is to provide improvements for 111 35 
to accommodate future traffic needs. The project is 
approximately 22 miles in length. The meeting will be 
held at the Gainesville Civic Center, 311 South Weaver 
Street, Gainesville, Urns on Tuesday, June 5, 2007. The 
public meeting will be an Open House format between 
the hours of 600 p.m. and 8:00 p.m. with a presentation 
at 700 p.m. 
The intent of the public meeting is to present the 
Preferred Alternative developed from comments at the 
last public meeting and to receive public input and to 
discuss the next steps in the study process. Maps. 
drawings, and other information about the project will 
be on display at the meeting to allow interested persons 
to learn more about the proposed project. Project 
personnel will be available to assist in orientation and 

interpretation of the drawings and other material on 
hand and discuss possible mobility and environmental 
effects of the proposed project. 
Each attendee will have the opportunity to provide the 
project team with comments and suggestions by 
discussion with the project team or by submitting 
written comments. All interest persons are invited to 
attend this Public Meeting and express their views on 
the proposed project. Verbal and written comments from 
the public may be submitted either in person or by mail 
to: 

Mr. Danny Brown, P.E.. Texas Department of 
Transportation. 1601 Southwest Parkway. Wichita 
Falls. Texas 76302 
Persons with disabilities who plan to attend this 
meeting and who may need auxiliary aides or services 
such as interpreters for persons who are deaf or hearing 
impaired, readers. large print or Braille are requested 
to contact Tammy Marlow at 1940/ 720-7741 two 12) 
weeks prior to the meeting no that appropriate 
arrangements tan be made. 

FOR SALE  



pIEZUOZ03) 
coWago* 

15560 Hwy 82, West 
940-759-2201 

Visit our website at: 
www.muen.sterlireatock.eom 

CATTLE AUCTION MEDIA 
REPORT 

Sale Date: May 24, 2007 
1321 head of Cattle Sold. Light 

Cattle & Feeder, slightly cheaper. 
Replacement cattle higher! 

Thank you for your business! 
Call us for all your cattle needs. 

STEERS 
300-10016.: $126 to $144; 
400-500 lb.: $111 to $129; 
500-600 lb.: $104 to $122; 
600-700 lb.: $100 to $119; 
700-80016.: $98 to $108. 

300-400 lb.:
UMEE 

 $115 to $128; 
400-50016.: $100 to $121; 
500-60016.: $100 to $116; 
600-70016.: $94 to $108; 
700-80016.: $91 to $99. 

PACKER COWS 
Utility Boning: $35 to $44; 
Canner/Cutter: $45 to $54; 

Bulls: $56 to $70. 
BRED COWS 

Choice: $820 to $940; 
Medium-Good: $710 to $800; 
Medium-Poor: $550 to $700. 

COW-CALF PAIRS 
Choice: $1150 to $1300; 

Medium-Good: $850 to $1100; 
Medium-Poor $700 to $825. 

EIVERpRisE 
Need your printing done? 

We can do it!! 

• Business Cards • Forms 
• Letterhead • Checks 

• Brochures • Programs 
• Flyers • Folding 

• Invitations 
Commercial Printing 

is our Specialty 

759-4311 

Gainesville Li  K Market Inc. 
NEW WEBSITE:  wutegaineseillelivestockinfol 

Light Weight Steers & Heifers - $2 to $3 LOWER. Feeder Steers & Hedr1> -
- STEADY. Pack, Cows & Bulls - STEADY to $1 LOWER. Bred Cows & 
Pairs - STEADY. Sold at Friday's sale May 25 were 791,compared to 711 the 
previous week. Sold at "Nesdays sale May 29 were 310 Goats, 190 Sheep, 
and I24 Hogs. The numbers from last week were 556 Goats, 143 Sheep, and 
141 Hogs. Results follow: 
Feeder Steers (per lb.) Stocker Cows (per head) 	Ewes (per lb.) 

299,9Q9Ih5.: No 1,1.39.150: Pregnancy-tested. 3 to 9- Stocker 45,55: Thin: .20- 
Nat.2 80,1.154.304a09,440 year-olds - Laree Frame: .35:Eat 20..43. 

	

Na 1, 1.23-1.32; Nos. 2 $8004979. Mndinnalrinne: 	Bucks (per lb.) 
& 3, 1.001.23; 400,500 In: 86704800. 	 Thin: 35.46. Eat: . 30-45 - 
No. 1, 1.11-1.27; Nos. 2 & 3, Cow/Calf Fairs 1y/calves 	Barbados (per head) 
.851.11;DOSaau No. I, under 250 lbs. • UM, Lamps: $15466, Ewa: $20- 

1.074.16; Nos. 2 & 3, .80 frame $950 -$1100,Mnilann 860.Reina. $55-$85. 
1.07.041516.1h6:Na 1, 68- frame: 57504950. 
1.05; Now 2 & 	/a Baby Calves Holegm NT 	Goats (per head) 
Wag:No. 1, .97-1.02; Nos. Cnifelinins_ $250-5325 	E16.5,2¢11.1&4. 520545a 
2 & 	 55 Its, 430.$60: 05-70 Inn. 

Feeder Heifers (per lb.) Barrows & Gilts (per lb.) $45480. 
29099Jnin No.1,1.15424: LIS912a219..52 ,60: 	Yearlings (per head) 
Now 2 & 3,1.104 15:,0 11112 mut& .45- .52. 	70120115s .1804125. 
BIL: No 1, 1.11 - 120; Now 2 	Feeder, (per head): 	Nannies (per head) 
& 3, 1.00-1.11;400-500 Ins; 100170 nis: $504100; 	Stocker: $55-$110: Mills 
No. 1, 1.05-1.16; Nos. 2 & 3, 2,0,99.1ba.:915-445. 	Ding; $35-$75; Slaughter. 

Mlilififtlilbs.: N. 1, 	Sows (per lb.) 	$50490: Thin. 538-£45; Eat 
1.02-1.12; Nos. 2 & 3, .85- feeder 400 or lets: .30.45; $30445. 
1.02; n042.001in: No. 1,99- Lieht wt. 400-500:.32-.36: 	Billies (per head) 
1.02; Nos. 2 &3, so-ssmit ader-in-irahcirs. .32-.36; 	120 lbs-up 
Imo,: No 1..97-1 00; Now Bea, on 600+:.32-.36. 	Bniedem. $904115. 
2 & 3, .55.97. 	 Boars: (per lb.) 	Slaughter- 875495. 
Slaughter Cattle (per 	3RILIkilui: NT. p 	,lh5, 	Boer Goats (per head) 

	

glugglhiggLield Grade 20-.33 •ietit wt.:  20.45. 	1/2 Nanny-. NT, 2/4 Nazagr. 
01-2-1200.2,050Iba,62 72: 	 NT, Full Nanny:  NT. 
SI.vhter Cows; 01 -3 .51 - 	 Sheep (per lb.) 	1/2 Rille  NT '94 Billy .  NT 

2.- 51 	Feeder lamb,  40-60x...80 bill& NT 
95; Liel4 Iambs 80-90 lbs  
80-99 Fat lamb, 90-120  (940) 665 -4367 

u. 	75. 

Wouldn't life 
be easier with 

ONE AGE NT 
to handle your 

insurance 
needs? 

Wherher you have a claim need to 

dtange coverage or Just have a question. 

Farm Bureau Insurance is really 

nvement. You always call the same 

(;ice and receive prompt. professional 

nice from your own pirsonal agent. 

rluz with our competitive rates, you may 

CSVC money. 

Helping You IS what we do best. 
Muenster 
1940)759-9052 

Gainesville 
(9901665-1763 

sfbh con • 'sib ins corn 

%Dos  form Sur. u Mutual !moron°,  Co  • too.* farm .uma Vrchrmiten 

seuleem inn 1.1.0 .1.04 ,,,,, nu. Co .Southorn rem I unau Lao ins 	Co 0,Iclon 

am, kooau County MulkslInsonnoo Cconpony ol Soros 

Haulin' The Hits 

www.KGAF1580.com  
• Swap-It-To-Me - the Original since 1947 
• Local Area Sports 
• News Talk 

Your Texas Country Connection Since 1917 
1500 AM 

Cooke County's 
Favorite 

Since 1947 

BOWIE 
LIV STOCK COMMISSION 

Sala Every Saturday 
Don .1 ac laigo Owno r 

800-391-2022 

132 
FM 174 [940-872-54411 

Save 50% on ANY 
Samsung Phone! 

Hurry in - 
Offer Ends 6/2! 

2200 E His) 82 

940-665-3347 
www.nortex.com  

Samsung SYNC 
500/ off requires mirumum data pack-
age of $9 99 or higher plus a 2-year 
commitment 

• Music 
• Video 
• Push to talk 

4 

Offer copses 6207 Oiler rondm® & redaction, eppIy See a:mart & rata brochure for deeds Subscribe roust We and hese area 
mg address wston AT&T,' ownednetwork coverage area Up to 536 etcovmon fee applies Etsupment pnce and avellabtley may vey by 
market and may not be available from adepeodent retaders Early Tendaannt Fee sane d cancelled m fan 30 days, thereafter $173 .  
Some agents may (emote additional fees 1.1alindled yoke nosh, Untested Vnee Services ere provided solely for bye &dog between 
two mdreduels Ofhet Usage( If your minutes of use (including unlimited voice some.) m other earners' networlo Collie usage) 

dump env two consecutive morels exceeds your Of Ir. age allowmce, AT&T my at its option wmmate your strews deny your acclai-
med use of other earners' coverage, or change your plan to one imposing usage charges for oflhet usage Your ofthet usage allowance ta 

otpol to the lesser of 750 rmout, ea 40% of the Anytime smote exhaled nosh your plea 1611bg. Usage toureled up to the mess full minute 

or lalobyte. a the moor sashed or data omen fin bdhng purposes Pore before mein rebate & dela p tck sip podase for the Sammeg 

phone a 599 99 Plane offers expire date package of 39 99 or fugaer Allow 10•12 weeks fot rebate card Rebate card not available m all 

lo colons Must be s customer for 30 consecutree days Must be poemanced by date =deeded m rebate from Seles to based on meetrveted 

egurpinent See none for details 0 30e AT&T 

Sale Oats: May 26, 2007 
Cattle sold thls week 260 

R1.41IGHTER CATTLE 

mmos w Al.  .35-.57 
Itituagter_To

e  i 	
qpn .55-.86 

Itv  
Canner & utter Cows 35-.57 • gja, 
nulls 55-.74, Md • Gd. Bulls 55-.74 

nTOCVER 4  FIXFOER FFARI  
C Ch .V74,•?-1:11151.1F6L, 
84-1.01, NalcirIdlarls .55- .86. 

$TOCKRR COWS 
NEG. TEsnto 3-9 re. OLDS 

.57, 

20, 59 '/ 
nder 50 50- 00. 

BABY CALYES 5200-&300 
STEELCALYliii 

lbs. Gd.-Choice 1.60, Med.-Gd. NT, 
lbs. Gd.-Choice 	Med.-Gd. 

NT, 19a19 lbs. Gd.-Choice 1.00-1.11, Med.- 
GENT, MEM lbs. Gd.-Choice .81,84, 

Mod.-Gd. NT. 
HEIFER CALVES 

200,m11bs. Gd.-Choice NT, Med.-Gd. 
NT, 30,90115s. Gd.-Choice .85-1.27, 
Med.-DIE NT 40,509 lbs. Gd.-Choice 
1.00-1.11, Med Gd NT, 5514511k,. • 
Gd.-Choice .78-1.09, Med.-Gd. NT 
gin STEIN STEER CALVES 

lbs. NT 
lba. 

I ta  .1 I 
SI ill 
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Texas Department of Agriculture raising 

penalties for weights & measures violations 

Clean manure may sound 
like an oxymoron, but Dr. 
Brent Auvermann is working 
with feedyard owners to help 
them get the most "spark 
from it as a fuel source. 

Auvermann, a Texas Coop-
erative Extension engineer-
ing specialist, hosted 
"Producing High-Value Ma-
nure for BioFuels and Fertil-
izer" recently in Hereford. 
The meeting outlined work by 
Texas Agricultural Experi-
ment Station researchers to 
determine best management 
practices for scraping manure 
from the feed pens. 

"We're doing something 
that has never been done be-
fore," said Arles "Bugs" Gra-
ham, Panda Energy 
International's general man-
ager for the Hereford plant. 
Graham spoke at the meet-
ing. 

"We're using your manure 
as an energy source," he said. 
"It's a very complex process." 

After starting up the plant 
with natural gas as the boiler 
fuel, Panda Energy will even-
tually use manure as a fuel 
source when producing etha-
nol for an ElO fuel blend, 
Graham said. 

The plant will initially pro-
cess corn for ethanol, al-
though the company is look-
ing at alternative sources of 
starch to make the ethanol, 
and it will produce distiller's 
grains as a by-product. 

But manure is our future," 
Graham said, estimating 
each plant will use 1,500 tons 
a day. 

Jim Adams, Panda Energy 
vice president-fuels, said the 
plant will begin asking yards 
in June to sign up for a per-
centage of their manure. 

The past winter was a 
wake-up call, Adams said. 
Sometimes when weather is 
too wet, manure can't be har-
vested from the pens. Manure 
will be used by this fall, so 
"we have to start stockpiling 
now" to ensure a 
steady supply. 

Adams said the plant will 
use manure on a six-day ba-
sis, requiring 70 to 80 truck-
loads per day. Panda's con-
tractor will collect from the 
pens when they are dry 
enough, but will need to pull 
from stockpiles when pen sur-
faces are too wet. 

Quality is the biggest issue, 
Auvermann said. The ma-
nure needs to burn at a mini-
mum rate of 2,758 British 
thermal units per pound of 
manure. That number 
changes according to the 
amount of pollutants - mois: 
ture and dirt-included when 
the pen is scraped. 

If all the water and con-
taminants were removed 
from the manure, the highest 
quality would be 8,500 Btu, 
"but we can't do that, because 
we can't take the ash out com-
pletely," he said. 

Manure from soil-surfaced 
pens may not always meet 
the minimum heating value 
on an as-received basis, 
Auvermann said. Feedyard 
operators will have to take 
some steps to improve it. 

The timeliness of collection 
and depth of scraping will be 
key to keeping dirt content 
below 60% and moisture con-
tent below 20%, he said. 

"Paving the pens with a 
crushed ash or a fly-ash ma-
terial (from coal-fired power 
plants) will end up returning 
to you in the form of heating 
value - big time,"Auvermann 
said. 

Partially composted ma-
nure from paved pens can 
have a heating value almost 
equivalent to that generated 
by burning Texas lignite coal, 
he said. 

Feedyard owners should 
consider the process as "har-
vesting manure" rather than 
cleaning pens, Auvermann 
said. The ultimate goal is to 
have a hard, smooth, well-
drained corral surface. 

Implementing good prac-
tices will pay at the bottom 
line, he said. Conscientious 
manure harvesting can result 
in higher fuel and fertilizer 
values, reduced feed require-
ments for cattle, improved 
pen drainage, and reduced 
odor, dust, and flies. 

As gasoline prices continue 
to increase, so will the cost for 
those caught cheating Texas 
drivers. Agriculture Commis-
sioner Todd Staples an-
nounced recently the Texas 
Department of Agriculture 
(TDA) is increasingpenalties 
for any fuel pump found out 
of tolerance in the state. This 
is the first time since 1996 
TDA has increased the pen-
alties for weights and mea-
sures violations. 

Gas prices are high enough 
without consumers getting 
shortchanged at the pump," 
Commissioner Staples 
said. "Drivers need to have 
confidence they are receiving 
exactly what they are paying 
for every time they fill up." 

In accordance with specifi-
cations published by the Na-
tional Institute of Standards 
and Technology, TDA tests 
fuel pumps using a tolerance 
of si•cubic inches - about six 
tablespoons - per five gal-
lons. The new penalties for 
first and subsequent offenses 
are based on how much a 
pump varies from the toler-
ance level. 

The penalties are: 
More than twice in excess 

of tolerance (12 cubic inches) 
- $100 per device for the first 
offense and $200 for each de-
vice for the second offense; 

More than three tunes in 
excess of tolerance (18 cubic 
inches) - $150 per device for 
the first offense and $300 for 
each device for the second of-
fense; and 

More than four times in ex-
cess of tolerance (24 cubic 
inches) - $250 per device for 
the first offense and $500 for 
each device for the second of-
fense. 

TDA has 72 weights and 
measures inspectors through-
out the state checking more 
than 68,500 fuel pumps a 
year. An inspector will place 
an "out of order" tag on any 
pump not dispensing the cor-
rect amount of fuel within the 
allowable tolerance. An en-
tire station can also be tagged 
out of order if a majority of 
the pumps are dispensing 
fuel in favor of the station 
owner, even if the pumps are 
within the tolerance level. 
The owner or operator is re-
sponsible for having a pump 
fixed and re-inspected by 
TDA before the pump can be 
further used to sell fuel. This 
is in addition to any penalty 
the owner or operator may 
incur. 

"At TDA, we take our con-
sumer protection efforts very 
seriously whether inspecting 

Oxygen depletion and 
fish kills 

Is your pond in danger of 
oxygen depletion, or some 
other risk factor that would 
cause a fish kill? Asking 
yourself the right questions 
after a fish kill could help you 
determine the cause if a fish 
kill occurs. Asking the right 
questions before a fish kill 
could help you to avoid the 
event. According to Dr. Billy 
Higginbotham, Texas Coop-
erative Extension wildlife 
specialist, the following ques-
tions should be made to help 
assess your risk level. 

1) How many different 
species are dying? What you 
are trying to determine with 
this question is that if more 
than one species of fish is dy-
ing, you probably are faced 
with a water quality problem 
(i.e., oxygen, ammonia, ni-
trites). If only one species of 
several species present are 
dying, it may be a disease/ 
parasite problem, but not al-
ways because different spe-
cies may have different toler-
ance levels for water quality 
parameters. If only one spe-
cies of fish is in the pond and 
a die-off is occurring, you 
need more information. 

2) Have any pesticides 
been used recently that were 
introduced into the pond? 
This could include pasture 
insecticides washing into 
ponds or even cattle that were 
treated with an insecticide 
standing in the pond to es-
cape the summer heat. 

3) How big is the pond? 
The pond owner usually 
thinks the pond is 2x to 3x 
larger than it really is. Walk 
them through the process of 
estimating surface area in 
acres by dividing square foot-
age by 43,560. Remember, 
excessive depth does not 
make up for lack of surface 
area when it comes to fish 
production! 

4) How many pounds of 
fish are present? Once you 
know the surface acreage, try  

eggs, grocery store scales, 
plants from nurseries, or gas 
pumps," Commissioned 
Staples said. "Since we over; 
see many regulatory pro! 
grams that directly impact a 
consumer's pocketbook, our 
inspectors are on thd 
frontlines, helping ensure 
shoppers are getting both 
high quality and accurate. 

 quantity for the products thei 
are buying." 

In addition to fuel pumps; 
TDA is also increasing fines 
for non-compliant commodity 
scales and pricing discrepan-
cies at the checkout counter. 
All of the new penalties went 
into effect May 25 

United States 
Agriculture 1920 
The annual loss of build-

ings in the U.S. from fires in 
1920 was estimated at 
$330,854,000, which included 
a large amount of wood. , 

The annual drain on our 
forests is four times as great 
as the amount of wood grown 
each year, nearly twice as 
great as we could grow under 
crude forestry. 

to determine the pounds of 
fish present by asking: (1) for 
an estimate of fish stocked 
(minus those caught out) and 
(2) the average weight of the 
fish present. This will help 
you estimate the total pound-
age of fish present. 

If the total pounds of fish 
exceed 1,000 pounds per sur-
face acre (that's only 100 
pounds in a 0.10 acre pond), 
you are probably dealing with 
an oxygen depletion. Thi4 
accounts for about 85% of all 
fish die-offs in Texas farni 
ponds!!! 

When the fish standing 
crop exceeds the 1,000 lbs./ 
acre carrying capacity during 
the hot months, the stage is 
set for a die-off. Why the 
summer months? Because 
warm water cannot hold as 
much oxygen as cool water, 
yet the fish need more be 
cause their metabolism (and, 
therefore their oxygen re-
quirements) increases as wa-
ter temperature increases. A 
farm pond that could easily, 
carry 2,000 to 3,000 pounds 
of fish per surface acre 
through the winter montha 
won't stand a chance once the 
dog days of summer arrive: 
Remember, oxygen is usually 
lowest right at daylight, so 
that's a good time to check 
and see if fish are swimming 
at or near the surface. In 
many cases, the larger fish 
will be the first to exhibit 
signs of oxygen stress. Now, 
that the "hammer is cocked"; 
additional events that could 
"pull the trigger" and furthed 
contribute to oxygen deple; 
tion include: 

1) A couple of hot, still; 
cloudy days in successio 
that reduce photosynthesis!

d 

 and therefore oxygen produc 
tion, 

2) Aquatic herbicide 
treatments in hot weather 
that kill too much vegetatiod 
in too short a period of tin* 
resulting in an oxygen deb 
and, 

Overfeeding/ 
overfertilization resulting in 
nutrient decomposition or 
phytoplankton die-off. 

Taking corrective action 
now by removing fish or aera 
Lion of the pond could save 
your fish. 

Samsung Phone Sale! 

County Agent's Report 

FARM  & RANCH 
Cleaner manure burns hotter 



$399  SHURFINE 	 $119 
Wild Bird Seed 	5 LB 

FARM FRESH 	5, Canta- 
loupes 
EACH 

QUALITY FRESH MEATS 
FISCHER'S,I & 2 LB. 
FROZEN 

Ground 
Beef 

189 

BLUE BUNNY. 

filek911.  
IF ■ 1111 

OINONIDWInle. 

PREFERRED TRIM 
BONELESS 
CENTER CUT 

Pork Loin 
Roast '2' 9  

$ Downy Fabric Softener. OZ. 299  
HIDDEN VALLEY SELECT GROUP • $c  
Salad Dressing 	16 OL A FOR 911/ 

SELECT GROUP GREEN BEANS, CORN OR PEAS 	$ 

Libby's Vegetables 11.15 .2 DL 2 FOR 

LONG SPAGHETTI OR ELBOW MACARONI 

ShurSaving Pasta 	31 OL 

4F,3!5 

APRIL FRESH OR CLEAN BREEZE 

HUNTS ASSORTED 

Spaghetti Sauce 	 
LAY S4 OR WAVY LArst 
Potato Chips 
FRITO. LAY 

Multi-Pack Chips 	 
K C. MASTERPIECE YOUR CHOICE 

Barbecue Sauce 	 
SELECT GROUP 1 LESS SUGAR 

Kellogg's Cereals 
BANQUET SELECT GROUP 

Homestyle Bakes 
SHURFINE SELECT GROUP 

Pasta with Meat 

$699  Luvs Diapers 	1640 CF 

GALLON OR QUART. FREEZER OR STORAGE 

Hefty OneZip Bags 11.22 C7 FOR $4 

SELECT GROUP ROOM DEODORIZER 

' Glade Aerosol 	 ..90L 99 

WESTERN FAMILY, 100, 200 OR 400 SPEED 	$ I 49 
35mm Film 	 24 EXP 

Outdoor Flood Light 	EACH $ 249  
SHURFINE ASSTD ORIGINAL OR SUGAR FREE 	$2 
Instant Pudding 	134-4 OL FOR 

LOUISIANA 	 C 
Hot Sauce 	 110L 99 

 

WESTERN FAMILY, 7S OR ISO WATT 

RICH ORIGINAL OR HASTERBLEND COFFEE 	$699 

Maxwell House 	34 5 59 DL 

mOTTS ORIGINAL. NATURAL OR CINNAMON 
1 $ 

Apple Sauce 	6 PACK A FOR —F 

SHURFINE BOWL. PLATES OR COMPART. PLATES 	$ 

Foamware 	24-S0 CT 2 FOR 

99°  

10 OL 99' 
153 OL 2E00.89' 

153 OL 2FOR89 C 

 I„ACK. 2 FOR

$

3 99  

$ P
3 

 99 
LB 

$199 
17.5 SQ FT 	I 

24 PACK, 12 OZ. 

Natural 
Light 

$ 1 I"  
GARDEN FRESH PRODUCE 

I LB $ 

199 

FRESH 

Broccoli Crowns 	LB 99' 

99' Celery 	 EACH 

RED CLUSTER 	
1 $ 

 

Tomatoes 	 I. LBS 

SELECT VARIETIES 

Dole Caesar Kits 	10 OL 2 
$ 

 FOR 

La. Squash 	  
ZUCCHINI 

$  PEELED 	 1 99  
Baby Carrots 	1 LB 

FRESH 	

' Sweet Potatoes 	LB. 89 
 

COLORADO 	

! I Baking Potatoes 	2 L 

TEXAS 1015 SWEET 	

69C 
 

Seedless Grapes 	LB. 
$ 1 49 

LARGE GREEN 	

$ Bell Peppers 	2..  
PEEK RED DELICIOUS OR EX. FANCY GRANNY SMITH 99C  
Washington Apples 	LB. 

RED RIPE 

Strawberries 

Apricots 	 LB 99' 
CALIFORNIA 

CRISP SLEEVED 

LARGE RED OR GREEN 

24 PACK - 12 OZ. CANS 

Coca Cola 
$649 

FROZEN & DAIRY 

 1646_5 OZ. J FOR

• $ 

 

 5 

REG. 53.19 A FOR

• $ 

 5 
$ 5 99 

24 PACK IW 

1  

18 DL 	FOR 4 
$149 

	10-173 OL 11/ 

$299 
.18.2-37 OL Oi 

IS OL 

C 

 wl FOR 5 

SIZES 2.6 JUMBO PACK 

SHURFINE 

Crystal Syrup 	52 DL 

DOLE ASSORTED 

Pineapple 
RANCH STYLE 

Beans 

A T 

We Wouldn't be 80 
Without You! 

QUANT TY R GHTS 
RESERVED ApRuATED 

FOODS NC. 
ALL ITEMS NOT 

AVAILABLE AT ALL 
AFFILIATED STORES 304 North Main, Muenster, TX 	I (800) 259-7248 or 759-42 I I 

www.fischersmeatmarket.com  
PRICES EFFECTIVE 
JUNE 4 - 10, 2007  DOUBLE COUPONS EVERY DAY 

tstber's Stint filarket 
Since 1927 	SENIOR CITIZENS.' No Amount of Purchase 

 Necessary on Limited Sale Items! 

NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR PICTORIAL OR TYPOGRAPHICAL ERRORS 

FOR 

OSCAR MAYER SELECT VARIETIES FUN PACK 1 
$ 

Lunchables 	 1055.11 .2 DL A FOR 

A 

 —N 

SELECT GROUP 
FAMILY SIZE 

Lipton 
Tea Bags 

18.24 CT. BOX 

2 $  

BIG ROLL 
BATHROOM TISSUE 

Charmin 
Basic 

11 ROLL 

$A 

100 OZ. LIQUID OR 61-0 OL POWDER 

Gain Detergent. YOUR CHOICE 
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WEEKLY SPECIALS 

VAN CAMP 

Pork & Beans 	 
MOUNTAIN MUSIC 

Drinking Water 
KINGSFORD 

Charcoal 
REYNOLDS 

Heavy Duty Foil 

HEALTH & BEAUTY CARE 

BLUE BUNNY 
ASSORTED FLAVORS 

DelMonte 	Ice 
Ketchup Cream 

24 OZ. 	 144 OL FAMILY SIZE 

79,  '499  

V Cut Up Fryers 	LB  
PILGRIM'S PRIDE GRADE A WHOLE 

FARM RAISED RAW 

EL MONTEREY FAMILY PACK 

LB '2 59  
$ 

1
1 89 

LB. 

IS 4 I7OL 2FOR$ 5 

$ I 49 
LB  

Catfish Nuggets 	 LB 99'  
$ 2 39  American Cheese 	LB 

MARKET WRAPPED 

Burritos or Chimichangas 40 OL $ 2 79  

FISCHER'S REGULAR OR HOT 

Hot Links 
HORMEL MARKET SLICED 

Pressed Ham 
MAMA ROSA'S ALL VARIETIES 

Mini Mama's Pizza 
MARKET SLICED 

Peyton Bologna 

ASSORTED ORIGINAL OR LEAN 

Michelina's Entrées 
CRUNCHY FILLETS 

Shurfine Fish 
PLAINS 

Choco Dream 

8.10 OL 4 FOR 5 

$3 99 
19.2.24 OZ. 

$ 

GAL A FOR 3 

BANQUET ASSORTED 

Pot Pies 	7 OL 3 FOR 2 

PATIO ASSORTED 

Enchilada Dinners ,i2..2501.5F0B$ 5 

PLAINS ASSORTED • $r  
Cottage Cheese 	24 OL A FOR 

KRAFT CHEDDAR. MONT. JACK CUBES OR ASSTD.  

Shredded Cheese 	 oz. 2F0,!4 

American Singles 	007_ $199 
BORDEN ORIGINAL, BIG OR 1% LOWFAT 

ASSORTED FRUIT FLAVORS 

Plains Punch 
PILLSBURY SELECT FLAVORS 

Grands! Biscuits 

Yellow Onions 	u1. 

GAL 89' 
• $ 16.3 OZ. A FOR 3 

WESTERN FAMILY TABLETS OR CAPLETS 
NAPROXEN SODIUM 

All Day 
Relief 
50 CT. BTL 

$ 349 
SELECT GROUP 	 $149 
Rolaids Antacid ...... 	CT J 
COMPLETE WITH LUTEIN OR THERA PLUS 	5599 
Western Family Vitamins 130 CT 

WESTERN FAMILY 

Hydrocortisone Cream.. . I OL 

949 

MAXIMUM STRENGTH OINTMENT 

Neosporin Plus 
LIQUID OR POWDER SPRAY 

Lotrimin AF 	  

$ 199 
. .5 OZ. 	PIP 

$5 49 
4.64.3 OZ. 

ASSORTED FLAVORS MOUTHWASH 	 99 
Listerine 	33.110L/ I LTIL 

:OAST OR SELECT GROUP DIAL 

Bath Bars 	1 PACK 3FoR$ 5 
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