
Germanfest 1979 will be headquartered in these facilities. Most of the con-
cessions are located in the big lent and entertainment will be in the park pavilion. 

--Staff photo 
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Going, Going, Gone! The Muenster overpass, shown here giving in to the im-
pact of an 8000 pound wrecking ball, was demolished in less than three days. 
Wednesday night most of the supporting piers were still standing but the spans 

between were reduced to piles of chunk concrete and twisted reinforcing steel. 
--Photo by Art's Photos 
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Germanfest is Here 
named Thursday night, along 
with other candidates of the 
Miss Muenster pageant. Also 
included will be vehicles with 
music and PA equipment, the 
Anheuser Bush hospitality 
coach and any other vehicles 
appropriate for the occasion. 

Alvin Fuhrman is the Ger- 

off Friday with a parade be-
ginning at 3:30 on Main Street 
and ending with a ribbon 
cutting ceremony at 4 p.m. at 
the park entrance for official 
opening of festivities. 

Participants will be Ger-
manfest committeemen and 
Miss Muenster, who will be 

Final preparations for Ger-
manfest got under way Mon-
day with erection of the big 
tent on the tennis courts of 
Muenster City Park, and con-
cessions people promptly got 
busy at setting up their 
booths. 

The big show will be kicked 

As before, foods will be 
available in variety a n d 
abundance. Along with saus-
age, at several places and in 
big supply, there will be fried 
chicken, barbecue, hamburg-
ers, hot dogs and a wide 
selection of baked goods. Soft 
drinks also will be available 
in a number of places, and 
so will be a variety of souv-
enirs. 

The big feature of the fes-
tival is the Fourth Annual 
German Fun Run sponsored 
by Muenster KCs and directed 
by Dan Hamric and Ronnie 
Hess. As many as 2000 entries 
are expected if the weather 
cooperates. It's a 15 kilometer 
race, 9.3 miles, starting at 2 

p.m. Saturday. 
Also featured arc three 

dances. A free street dance 
with music by Hay Fever will 
be held in the park Friday 
night 8 to 12. And there will 
be two dances Saturday night 
from 9 to 1. Cherry Rhone will 
play at the VFW Hall and the 
Polka Patriots of Ennis will 
play at the Community Cen-
ter. 

Still another feature is an 
art show and exhibit of works 
by SHS Art students, grades 
one through twelve, in the SH 
High School Hallways, Sun-
day. 1 p.m. to 5 p.m. for view-
ing by the public. 

And there will he horse-
(Continued on Page 12) 
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Fun Run Expected 
To Set New Record 
With the starting whistle 

for the fourth annual German 
Fun Run only a few days 
away, the indication is that it 

manfest chairman and John-
ny Fisher and Jane Monday 
are co-chairmen. They repre-
sent the Muenster Chamber 
of Commerce, the sponsoring 
organization. 

For the second consecutive 
year the big festival is being 
held in the city park, which 
proved last year to be a pleas-
ant location with ample space. 
The only misgiving concerns 
the weather. Heavy rain could 
bring on a serious mud pro-
blem at the festival area ex-
cept on the limited space cov-
ered by gravel or pavement. 

Also it could eliminate all 
parking near the Germanfest. 
In that case people will be 
advised to leave cars up-town 
and a shuttle bus route will 
be set up to carry people to 
and from the park. If weather 
is dry, parking space will be 
available on vacant lots of 
the area. However, parking 
will not be allowed beside 
Cross and Maple Streets, 
which are official highway 
detours while the overpass 
replacement project is in pro-
gress. 

The center of activity will 
be the big 60x120 foot tent, 
which includes most of the 
concessions. Nearby is the 
Jaycee pavilion, which will 
be headquarters for enter-
tainment, and a number of 
other concessions, especially 
the beer stand, fiod stands 
and kiddies' amusement facil- 
ities, including a mini train. 

Among attractions sched-
uled for the pavilion is a suc-
cession of musical programs 
by a number of bands and 
vocal groups along with dance 
acts and various contests. 

New for the beer conces-
sion this year is a specially 
built refrigerated truck with 
kegs inside attached to 32 
outside spigots, each identified 
by the brand of beer it dis-
penses. A counter extending 
the length of the van is set 
up at each side and barten-
ders serve in the area be-
tween the van and the coun-
ter. Also new in the beer de-
partment a r e Germanfest 
souvenir cups, in 20 ounce 
size. 

DST Will 
Arrive Sunday 

Buffet Honors Pageant Entries 

Clock changing time is here 
again. Sunday morning the 
nation will officially return 
to Daylight Saving Time 
which will be an hour ahead 
of sun time and our present 
time. According to the clocks 
daylight will arrive an hour la-
ter but will also remain an 
hour longer in the evening. 

People are reminded to set 
their clock ahead an hour 
some time during the night 
Saturday. If they fail to make 
the change they may find 
themselves an hour late for 
church services Sunday morn-
ing. 

The year now is divided 
evenly into DS and Stand-
ard time. Next time to change 
clocks will be the last Sunday 
of October, when the setting 
will be back an hour to agree 
with the sun again. 

will set a new record of par-
ticipation. At the past week-
end more than 600 runners had 
registered and the figure is 
expected to increase to more 
than 1000 by Friday night, in 
the opinion of Dan Hamrie 
and Ronnie Hess, who are in 
charge of the show. 

Both still have high hopes 
of reaching the 2000 mark in 
spite of a couple of discour-
aging factors, such a conflict 
of date with a fun run in 
Dallas and being wary of the 
weather after more than aver-
age rainfall in recent weeks. 
Experience has shown that 
sign ups lag when prospective 
runners are more conscious 
of possibly being tamed out. 
In the end the real determin-
ing factor will the weather 
on Saturday. the day of the 
race. If it dawns clear and 
bright the runners are ex-
pected to come in droves as 
they did before. However, a 
gloomy day will dampen en-
thusiasm. 

Unless the weather causes 
trouble. Ham and Rumpy are 
confident of setting a new re-
cord. They base their guess 

(Continued on Page 12) 

Overpass Redu ced to Rubble 

Fifteen Miss Muenster con-
testants were feted at a buf-
fet salad supper Sunday at 
5.30 p.m. in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Wilde. 

As they arrived, they were 
video-taped on TV by Mr. 
Wilde to simulate recording 

Myra Judged as 
Top Community 

Myra was rated Number 1 
last week in district judging 
of the state-wide Community 
Improvement program. The 
distinction, brings an award 
of $100 plus eligibility to ad-
vance to the regional level of 
competition. 

Five o t her communities 
were candidates for the hon-
or. Three of them, Ross Point, 
Hood and Era, are in Cooke 
County, Cottonwood i s in 
Kaufman County and Friend-
ship in Johnson County. Judg-
ing at Myra was done 10 to 
12 am. on April 17 and the 
good news was received at 5:15 
on the 19th. Judging in the 
regional is dated May 23. 

Leon Fuhrmann, one of the 
leaders in Myra's effort, said 
that a big factor in Myra's 
rating was organization of the 
community fire department 
and building the fire station. 
The project involved hard 
work and cooperation to raise 
funds, plus more of the same 
in work on the truck and 
building. Involvement in 
other endeavors and coopera-
tion with other communities 
also received favorable con-
sideration. 

Between-act entertainment 
includes the Cooke County 
College Pop Singers, a select 
group. Also a dance number 
by Lisa Shankles and Penny 
Scull of Gainesville, the dance 
choreographed by Ken Pres-
cott of Dallas. 

Gina Hofbauer, of Muen-
ster, reigning Texas Ideal 
Miss, will sing and dance to 
"Toot. Toot, Tootsie", the 
number which won for her 
the State Title and placed 
her in the Top Ten in World 
Finals. Gina Hofbauer and 
Shelley Rae Walterscheid will 
perform a Disco Dance to 
"Shake Your Groove Thing." 

Janet Danglmayr will dance 
to "Heaven Knows." Wanda 
Schneider and Dea Swirczyn-
ski will present a Mime, "Send 
in the Clowns." 

J. J. Dowd will perform 
"Playmates" a song and tap 
dance act, singing to Christin 
Cain. J. J. will join her sis-
ter, Gina in "Medley." J. J. 
Dowd was Texas runner-up in 
last year's Our Little Miss, La 
Petite contest. 

The Miss Muenster Pageant 
is sponsored by Beta Kappa. 
It will have two beneficiaries, 
the Love Fund in Muenster 

(Continued on Page 12) 

Fish Coming May 1 
People who ordered fish 

through the SCS office in 
Muenster, will be able to pick 
up their fish next Tuesday, 
May I, at 9:30 a.m. at Muen-
ster Livestock Auction. Fish 
will be available only to per-
sons who placed the advance 
order. 

clear the site if weather re-
mains favorable. 

The remaining job involves 
digging up and hauling away 
the approach to the overpass 
and removing the rubble. The 
approach. slightly more than 
a block long starts at the Elm 
Creek bridge and rises to 
about 20 feet at the overpass. 
Dirt to cover the road sur-
face while removing the last 
span was taken from there. 

Removing the rubble re-
quires preliminary work. Big 
chunks of concrete are fur-
ther smashed to required size 
and salvage steel is removed 
with cutting torches. 

work is in progress. Prepar:ng 
to remove the last span, the 
area west of it was cleared 
of debris and the surface was 
shaped to serve as the road. 
Then the pavement was cov-
ered with some four feet of 
dirt for cushioning while the 
last span was knocked down. 
Finally rubble and dirt were 
cleared away and traffic was 
routed back to the original 
detour. 

Though the bridge remov-
al project appears to be far 
advanced, it is still far from 
finished. Tom Carey, super-
intendent, estimates that two 
more weeks will be needed to 

Demolition work on the 
Muenster overpass has been 
in high gear since Monday 
when two crane operators of 
Orval Hall Excavating, with 
their 8000 pound wrecking 
balls, started smashing the 
road surface. By Wednesday 
night all 21 spans of the 690 
foot structure had been re-
duced to tangled steel and 
concrete. waiting to be hauled 
away. Most of the supporting 
piers still remained standing. 

All but one of the spans 
had been battered down in 
the first two days. It remained 
over Maple Street, which is 
serving as the detour while 

procedures, since at all re-
hearsals the contestants are 
taped as a means for them to 
see themselves and work on 
needed improvements. 

At the party in the Wilde 
some a buffet held an assort-
ment of salads prepared by 
Beta Kappa members, hosts 
for the event. The attractive 
table centerpiece, arranged by 
Louise Fisher, was a silver 
tray of macaroon tarts filled 
with strawberries and fruit. 
Contestants were Seated at 
three tables decorated with 
silk flowers in the Spring 
theme. The elegant guest 
tables and serving table were 
appointed with china and 
crystal. The salad supper 
was held to honor the 
girls, give them a dress-up 
party, teach etiquette and 
help to develop poise and self-
confidence. 

At this time they met the 
judges of the pageant and 
talked with them. Judges 
were seated at tables with 
the girls during the first 
course, changing tables for 
the dessert course and once 
more later in the evening, to 
afford judges the opportunity 
to meet each girl. 

After the party, the girls 
changed to casual wear for 
practice in the MRS Auditor-
ium. The sponsoring organiza-
tion is very pleased with the 
talent show to be presented 
during the Pageant and con-
siders that one of the high 
points of the evening. Area 
residents and visitors are 
urged to attend the pageant 
Thursday evening to enjoy 
and become aware of local 
talent. 

Congressman Charles Sten-
holm recently stated that fed-
eral paperwork is a burden 
to the country and that one 
of his principal objectives 
while in office is to work to-
ward relieving the exasperat-
ing situation. Considering that 
Senators Tower and Bentsen 
have aired similar sentiments 
on the subject, it is pleasing 
to note now that our area is 
well represented on the issue. 

If the three of them will 
work on the project, to get it 
introduced in congress and 
seek all possible support for 
passage. we feel that they 
have a good chance to get the 
legislation approved. T h e 
first reason is that the idea 
makes sense and deserves con-
sideration on its own merit. 
And the second reason is that 
sufficient effort can get the 
subject snowballing ... to the 
extent that smart politics will 
require the lawmakers to fav-
or the taxpayers rather than 
the bureaucrats who are the 
only real beneficiaries of fed-
eral over-regulations. 

Stenholm observes that fed-
eral paperwork generates al-
most seven billion cubic feet 
of paper annually and con-
tributes to an economic bur-
den of more than $40 billion 
a year. "This massive wasted 
effort stifles innovation, in-
hibits productivity and ac-
celerates inflation." Incident-
ally that estimated cost is 
considerably more than the 
expected budget deficit of the 
year. By eliminating this one 
burden the lawmakers could 
take a giant step toward cur-
ing inflation and gradually 
restoring the value that has 
been stolen from the nation's 
savings. And, of course, it 
would have the bonus benefit 
of relieving millions of people 
of the unnecessary job of 
filling out the bureaucratic 
forms. 

The only trouble with Sten-
holm's idea is that it isn't 
realistic. As much as we hate 
the long forms, many of them 
filled out in quintuplicate, we 
have to admit that we the 
public raised them to their 
current status of a necessary 
evil. As Paul Harvey says, 
when free people fail to dis-
cipline themselves they invite 
the government to impose reg-
ulations. Or, as Stenholm puts 
it, "this information glut is a 
reflection of a society that is 
beginning to mistrust itself." 
The regulations we have to 
live with became necessary 
when people tried to cheat 
their government or their 
neighbors. Ironically, t h e 
cheaters themselves, scheming 
for the unjustified income, 
have had occasion to learn 
that their self created penal-
ty offsets the ill gotten penal-
they were trying for. 

Blenheim names examples 
of regulations that have been 
imposed because too many 
people were failing to regu-
late themselves. The Occupa-
tional Safety and Health Ad-
ministration  was set up to es-
tablish health and safety 
guidelines because industry 
had ignored the safety and 
health of its workers. The 
Equal Employment Opportun-
ity Commission similarly im-
posed hiring and firing rules 
because employers had not 
been impartial in assigning 
jobs. Likewise, the Environ-
mental Protection agency was 
established to reduce pollution 
because contaminents h a d 
been dumped into air and wa-
ter. 

In each of those cases, the 
paperwork really should not 
have been begun. If the of- 

f fenders had been more con- 
(Continued on Page 12) 

Fifteen girls will vie for the honor of reigning over 
Germanfest and representing Muenster at various events 
next year. The winner will be named at the Miss Muen-
ster Pageant Thursday evening. Contestants, left to 
right, front row, are Sherri Wolf, Tami Fanning, Rene 
Stelzer, Peggy Sue Winn, Terrye Flusche, Laurie 

Walterscheid, Julia Bright , Christi Felderhoff and 
Rhonda Endres. Back row, Charlotte Fleitman, Judy 
Walterscheid, Donna Hennigan, Barbara Gonzalves, 
Cathy Flusche and Jo Ann Gibson. 

--Photo by Art's Photos 
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slim digitals 

with slim prices. 
This Pulsar Quartz Digital has it 011 

• Exceptional slimness 
• Continuous display of hour an,: 

minute 
• Second, month, cloy and date 0 

demand 
• Builian illumination 
• Approximately two-year battery life 

There's on impressive selection of 
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prices for oil this beauty and technology 
ore astoundingly low. Come see our new 
Pulsar quality quartz collection today . 

You'll find your own favorite. 
Pulsar Quartz. Always a beat beyond 
In technology. In value. 

Sanders Jewelry j 
105 S. Commerce. 665-2242. Gainesville 
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PROCLAMATION 
WHEREAS; on April 27th, 28th and 29th the re-
sidents of Muenster will join others over the Un-
ited States in celebrating the 296 anniversary of 
the establishment of the first German colony on 
American soil; and 

WHEREAS; since October 1683, descendant of 
those first settlers have observed the anniversary 
of that first landing and the custon has spread 
over the country until it has become a nation-wide 
observance; and, 

WHEREAS; the citizens of German ancestry have 
contributed greatly to the continuing welfare and 
advancement of the United States, and specifically 
have played an important part in the settlement 
and development of our own state; and, 

WHEREAS; Muenster was founded 90 years ago 
by the Flusche Brothers, Emil, August, and Anton 
Flusche, as a German community for pioneers 
from throughout the United States and the world, 

NOW, THEREFORE, 1, as Mayor of the City of 
Muenster, in recognition of this role of individuals 
of German descent in the progress of our nation, 
our state, and our city, do hereby proclaim April 
27th, 28th, and 29th as 

GERMANFEST 
lime in Muenster and urge all citizens to join with 
their neighbors and friends in giving due recog-
nition to this important celebration, 

Dial 

759-2833 

STORE HOURS 

Moo - Frt , 8104 

Saturday, 810.4 

Closed Sunday 

Muenster Pharmacy 
Bob Pals. Registered Pharmacist 

Medical Center Bldg. 

Loyalty Day Proclamation 
WHEREAS The progress, tranquility and wor-

thy influence of our city depends in large measure 
upon the determination of its citizens to create and 
to maintain vigorously the loyalty practice of true 
American ideals, and ... 

WHEREAS It behooves us to periodically take 
stock of our achievements in such maters and to 
strengthen our stand against any influence either 
foreign or domestic, which might threaten to dis-
turb our preferred way of life, and ... 

WHEREAS There is in our nation evidence of 
some subverting frees endeavoring to undermine 
and destroy American unity, now ... 

THEREFORE 1, Leonard Endres, Mayor of the 
City of Muenster, do hereby concur with our nat-
ional and state leaders in praising the concept of 
LOYALTY DAY, celebrated on the first day of 
May; and in further support of that special occas-
ion I do urge every citizen, school, church organ-
ization, business establishment and home within 
my official jurisdiction to display the flag of our 
country proudly and to participate in public de-
monstration and ceremonies sponsored by the 
Veterans of Foreign Wars of the United States, 
and others, on LOYALTY DAY, May the first, 
nineteen hundred and seventy nine. 

(Signed) Leonard Endres, Mayor 

Muenster Milling Co. 
Is now a 

Shawnee Feeds dealer 

If you raise It... 
we have the feed for It! 

Come by and get acquainted 
and see our complete 

line of Shawnee Feeds. 

irr■ 
SHAWNEE 

18% Lay Pellets 
15% Lay Pellets 
Rabbit Pellets 
Dog Food 
Game Bird Food 
Wild Bird Seed 
Fish Feed 

Muenster Milling Co. 
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SUS I 	Gov. Bill 

t lenient. si king to his un-
piedictable ways, said this 
week he will veto any mea-
sures passed by the Legisla-
ture designed to raise interest 
rates on home mortgages. 

Piling one surprise on top 
of another, Clements didn't 
just say he would but actual-
ly did veto a bill that would 
have let truckers set their 
own rates before bringing 
them to the Railroad Com-
mission for approval. 

Clements described the 
trucking legislation as "bad 
public policy:' and said the 
hill could have exempted the 
trucking industry from state 
antitrust laws. 

The governor saved his 
heaviest criticism for legisla-
tion that would have raised 
the home loan interest rate 
allowed by law from 10 to 
12 percent. Clements said it 
took a certain amount of 
"audacity" on the part of the 
savings and loan industry "to 
come to the Legislature ask-
ing for more money" when 
S&L institutions are already 
reporting record-high profits. 

Sen. Bill Meier, the spon-
sor of legislation to raise the 
home loan interest ceiling. 
predicted a recession because 
of Clements' move "and 
more probably a depression 
in the Texas housing indus- 

But Clements said he had 
heard no convincing argu-
ments to raise interest rates 
"when the average Texan is 
fighting just to keep his head 
above water financially." 

Spokesmen for the savings 
and loan industry said first-
time home buyers and sellers 
of used homes would find 

fewer mortgages on the mar-
ket and higher down pay 
ments on those mortgages 
that were available. 

Clements said he would 
consider calling a special ses-
sion if there is a serious 
housing slump. 

Consumer groups warned 
1, ,  beware of a "backdoor" 

iyiegy that might be used 
to. in effect, get the interest 
rates increased by reducing 
the penalties for charging 
more than the 10 percent 
now allowed by the law. A 
hill reducing penalties for 
savings and loan institutions 
that charge more than the 
legal limit has already passed 
the House. 

Meier. who last week 
managed to pass legislation 
that will weaken the Con-
sumer Proteettoo 5,t  

announcement 01 
a veto means his legislation 
is "dead." 

A veto can be overridden 
by a two-thirds vole but it 
hasn't been done since 1941 
and up until that time, the 
Legislature has seen fit to 
overturn only 25 guberna-
torial vetoes. 

Teacher Pay Raises 

Now that legislators know 
how Clements feels about 
interest rates, they can get 
on to other more pressing 
matters such as teacher pay 
raises. The governor has 
kept no one in the dark 
about how he feels on this 
subject. 

From the outset, Clements 
made clear that he favored 
only a 5.1 percent pay boost 
for all state employees, in-
cluding teachers. 

This week, seven of the 
state's largest school districts 
sent representatives to an 
half-hour meeting with the 
governor, and Linus Wright, 
Dallas school superintendent, 
said Clements made clear 
"he was not going to change 
his position" on teacher pay 
raises. 

All of the superintendents 
said the governor's proposal 
of a 5.1 percent increase was 
unacceptable. "That is not 
going to be sufficient to meet 
the needs of our teachers," 
Austin superintendent Jack 
Davidson told reporters after 
meeting with the governor. 

The superintendents said 
local school districts will 
have to come up with the 
money (or bigger teacher pay 
raises if the Legislature goes 
ahead with Clements' plan to 
boost salaries by only -  5.1 
percent. Wright. Davidson 
and other superintendents 
felt a 7 percent pay hike was 
justified. 

School officials said Clem-
ents wasn't all that receptive 
to their pleas for teachers to 
be treated differently than 
other state employees. But 
the superintendents fowl 
the governor "very recep-
tive" to the suggestion that 
large metropolitan districts 
like Dallas and Houston be 
treated differently. 

Most of the larger school 
districts have already put in-
to effect some of the changes 
Clements called for during 
his gubernatorial campaign 
last year. such as compe-
tency testing for students. 

The governor also assured 
the superintendents that the 
will have a voice in school 
matters through Clement, - 

 education task force. 

Short Snorts 

The government has 
hoisted the warning flags 
again, telling American mo-
torists there may not be 
enough gas to run their cars 
on by the time slimmer rolls 
around. Despite the warn-
ings, consumption is up by 
four percent over this time 
last year. 

One demand that Gas . 
Clements has been making  

this session is that legislators 
vote into law some kind of 
proposal that would give the 
voters initiative and referen-
dum rights. Such legislation, 
for all practical purposes, 
has been beached in both 
houses, but Clements has 
threatened a special session 
if no such bills reach his 
desk. 

Lt. Gov. Bill Hobby and 
Speaker of the House Bill 
Clayton seem to have come 
up with a proposal that will 
pacify the governor— indi-
rect initiative powers. Under 
such a plan, voters would be 
able to present laws to the 
Legislature and have them 
considered like any other 
major piece of legislation. 
Clements said he would sup-
port indirect initiative pow-
ers as long as voter-proposed 
laws have to come up for a 
vote in the Legislature. 

Bingo was a loser in the 
House of Representatives 
this week. Sen. Babe 
Schwartz of Galveston go( 
his bill legalizing the game 
through the Senate but his 
legislation fell 16 votes short 
of the required 100 votes for 
a constitutional amendment 
to pass the House. Lawmak-
ers also failed to approve 
legislation banning corporate 
and personal income taxes. 

While the federal govern-
ment was telling its to drive 
less and save gasoline. legis-
lators were getting their 
tanks filled tip with "gaso-
hol," a fuel made by mixing 
gasoline and alcohol made 
from farm products. 

Rep. Dan Kubiak. the 
prime mover behind "gaso-
hol" in this state, said it 
could serve as "one of the 
immediate answers to our 
fuel crisis." 

"Gasohol" is made from 
90 percent gasoline and 10 
percent alcohol and hackers 
of the fuel claim it can be 
burned in most cars without 
any expensive alterations. 
The idea of "gasohol" is 70 
years old. Kubiak pointed 
oat, and I, stoles already 
have it available. Cars burn-. 
ing "gasohol" supposedly 
have less engine wear and 

produce fewer pollutant, 

Report your News 
to the 

ENTERPRISE 
759-4311 

Washington, D.C.-Old 
bureaucrats never die and 
never fade away. Government 
agencies remain in existence 
well after they have ceased to 
become effective. 75% of the 
current Federal budget is 
beyond immediate Congres• 
sional control. 800 of more 
than 1,200 spending programs 
are permanent and never come 
under any regular Congres-
sional review. Many of these 
programs do not serve a mean-
ingful function but perpetuate 
themselves in order to provide 
job security for administrators 
of these non-essential agen-
cies. 

Many obsolescent govern-
ment bureaucracies often re-
quire substantial increases in 
funding each fiscal year. In the 
past several years this Country 
has tried to solve its difficult 
social problems by spending a 
little more money. When these 
programs do not work the 
answer has mistakenly been to 
pour in more money. The food 
stamp program cost $500 
million in 1964, but in 1979 the 
bill is 57 billion. The Com-
prehensive Employment and 
Training Act ICETAI was 
originally funded at 51.4 billion 
in 1970; in 1980 it will cost over 
StO billion. One of the largest 
white elephants ever con-
ceived — (OSHA) — cost the 
taxpayers 535.8 million in 1972, 
but in 1980 we will spend 
5179.5 million to perpetuate 
the existence of this inefficient 
agency. Even this figure is 
deceiving because of the large 
amount of compliance and 
paperwork costs necessary to 
conform to their regulations. 

We are becoming prisoners 
of our own law making 
authority and delegating our 
legislative and spending 
powers to unelected 
bureaucrats who are not 
responsive to public demands. 
This lack of legislative initiative 
has caused us to ascribe our 
own failures to the operations 
of forces which are entirely 
beyond our control and wider 
in range than the compass of 
Congressional action. Infla-
tion, budgetary deficits, and 
trade deficits have become en-
trenched in our economy. Our 
present "austere" federal -
budget is 530 billion in the red. 
It was good news to hear we 
only had a 51.3 billion trade 
deficit in February. Clearly it is 
time for a reevaluation of our 
legislative goals. 

I believe one of the best 
ways to come to grips with this 

problem is by terminating 
almost all federal programs 
after a ten year period if they 
are not reauthorized by Con-
gress. This would allow the 
legislative branch greater con-
trol over the 800 programs that 
now have permanent 
authorization. I have intro-
duced legislation that incor 
porates this "sunset" ap-
proach. This is a logical way to 
phase out these programs 
which have served their pur-
pose or have proved to be un-
successful. I believe that we 
must take positive action to in-
itiate a workable agenda to pin-
point programs that are not 
working and make more room 
for those that are effective. It is 
time for the sun to set on much 
of our Federal bureaucracy. 

Leonard Endres 
Mayor, The City of Muenster 

  

STATE CAPITAL HIGHLIGHTS 
By Lynda Williams 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 
It 

Ma 
key , 

 beans , ' 

wet 
chest ' 
frail isf 

1110 
kraut ,  
noon 

F rtdt  
and cl 

vivo 

Bob's 
Auto Service 

Now Repairing 

Radiators 

759-4474 

EXTINGUISHERS 
ABC and BC 

Compact, refillable fire extinguishers charged 
with ammonium phosphate dry chemical. 

Rated all purpose for fighting wood, paper and 

fabric fires, plus grease, flammable liquids (gasoline, 
oil) and electrical equipment fires (motors, appliances, 
etc.) Ideal for homes, shops, motor vehicles and boats. 

You can see them now at Community Lumber Co., along 

with other items for your home and garden. 

Community Lumber Co. 
Muenster 
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WEEKLY SPECIALS 
Monday, Meat Loaf 	  $3.05 
Tuesday, Mexican Dinner 	  $3.05 
Wednesday, Liver & Onions 	  $3.05 
Thursday, Chicken & Dumplings 	 $2.00 

(All You Can Eat ) 

Friday, '/2 Pound Fish Dinner 	 $3.05 
All with 2 vegetables, drink & dessert 

and tax included. 

* * * * * 	* * 

DAILY SPECIALS 
Chicken Fried Steak 	 , 	 $3.05 
Hall Fried Chicken 	  $3.05 
Polish Sausage 	  $3.05 
Roast Beet 	  $3.05 

All with 2 vegetables, drink & dessert 
and lax inc!uded. 

WE'RE OPEN SATURDAYS 

Jerry's Kountry Kooking 
305 N. Commerce, 665-0405, Gainesville 
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a pair of 1979 
Suzuki CS S e.1r etbikes 

Like to win a streetbike for both you and your favorite person? Then 
come on down and enter our free drawing. You could win two of the 

finest machines on the road today. Suzuki's powerful OS-1000 and 

sporty GS-425. All you need to enter is a valid driver's 
license. No purchase necessary. And well give you a 

FREE Suzuki Team Cap lust for entering. So come on 
down and enter. And bring your favorite person. 

Suzuki. The performer. 

Gainesville Cycles 
201 Summit 	665-5032 	Gainesville 
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Jennie Schilling Reigned at 1901 Fest 
S.H. School Menu 

April 30-May 4 
Monday - Barbecued Tur 

key, Potato Salad, bake • 
beans, pineapple, bread, milk. 

Tuesday - Pot Luck! 
Wednesday - Bologna and 

cheese, french fries, salad, 
fruit bread and milk. 

Thursday - Sausage, sauer-
kraut, mashed potatoes, cin-
namon rolls, milk. 

Friday - Sloppy Joes, carrot 
and celery sticks, fruit cup, 
mil k.  

Wunderbar1 	(Wonderfull) 

Jennie Schilling is Muen-
ster's sole surviving former 
Queen of the Schiitzenfest, 
fore-runner of Muenster's 
Germanfest. At age 18 she 
reigned for three days over the 
1901 community celebration 
as Jennie Sieger. 

Her selection came as a com-
plete surprise to her. At the 
time she was working in 
Gainesville at the Jake Schiff 
Store. It was an afternoon in  

!early May when the store own-
er told her a phone call in-

. structed him to tell her to rush, 
'dress up, catch the 4 p.m. train 
to Muenster. Arriving at the 
old Depot, she was met by the 
Muenster Brass Band, told the 
good news and accompanied 
to the picnic area to be 
crowned Queen of the Schiit-
zen f est . 

She was chosen by her fiance', 
Joe Noggler, King of the 
Schiitzenfest who won his 
crown at an earlier event, 
when his accurate shot filled 
the carved wooden eagle, long 
associated with Schiitzenfest 
celebrations. 

The community celebration 
lasted for three days. Each 
day the queen wore a white 
dress, a red, white and blue 
silk banner and a corsage. The 
King wore a black suit, a black 
silk top hat, a similar patriotic 
silk banner. 

Jennie said: "There were 
games for entertainment. 
There was dancing all after-
noon and evening to music by 
the Band. And the food was 
great-all German standards, 
nothing fancy. In later years I 
helped cook the same foods 
for other celebrants. And, be-
lieve me, they celebrated ... 
three days worth." 

When asked "How many at-
tended?" she said "everybody 
in Muenster and almost every 
one in Lindsay. It was a great 
party for homefolks. The 
days were good, the food was 
good and, it's still fun to just 
remember." Jennie was 
telling this story Tuesday, with 
delight. 

And then Jennie began 
showing pictures and keep-
sakes. There was the picture 
of the Schiitzenfest King and 
Queen and then their wedding 
picture. Joe Noggler and Jen-
nie Sieger were married on 
November 22, 1902. In keep-
ing with the style those days, 
her dress was burgundy silk, 
her veil was white, and there 
was a spray of lily of the 
valley. 

They were parents of two 
daughters, Rosalie, (Mrs. Bill 
Haverkamp) and Gusta (Mrs. 
Alphons Walterscheid) and 
three sons, the late Tony 
Noggler and Lawrence Nog-
glee of Muenster and the late 
John Noggler of Hereford. 
Jennie's husband died in 1918, 
a victim of the flu epidemic  

that swept the country during 
World War I. 

Many years later she married 
John Schilling. They were 
parents of one daughter, Anna 
Marie (Mrs. Anton Fleit-
man.) 

Jennie said "I have lots of 
grandchildren and great - 
grandchildren" (proudly 
showing pictures). At age 96, 
she has been a resident of St. 
Richard's Villa for eight years. 
She keeps busy sewing, her 
mind is alert, her sense of 
humor is delicious, her 
eyesight is good, but some-
times she gets frustrated 
threading a needle and must 
"try later." 

About her treadle sewing 
machine and her sewing, she 
mentioned making thousands 
of lap robes and lap covers for 
patients. By actual count, she 
said, over 4,000 in 8 years. 
Fabrics are given her by fri-
ends, many of the finished 
robes are given by others as 
gifts; many are sent overseas, 
many to other rest homes. She 
charges nothing, but will ac-
cept a nominal amount to help 
defray shipping expenses. 

Monday of this week she had 
some teeth pulled. She made a 
grudging concession to her 96 
years the next day by admit-
ting to being slightly aware of 
it, saying ... " it did not keep 
me from talking so much". 
And immediately she turned 
again to her treadle sewing 
machine. 

PROCLAMATION 
WHEREAS, Epsilon Sigma Alpha, the first non-
collegiate sorority in America, was founded in 
1929 as an organization in which women could 
learn, grow and serve together; and 

WHEREAS, Epsilon Sigma Alpha has achieved a 
position of high esteem for providing hope, assist-
ance and answers in areas of need; and 

WHEREAS, Such important contributions made 
by Epsilon Sigma Alpha have become an integral 
part of our communities; 

NOW, THEREFORE, I Leonard J. Endres, 
Mayor of the City of Muenster, State of Texas, do 
hereby declare the week of May 1-7, 1979, as Ep-
silon Sigma Alpha Fiftieth Anniversary Week, 
and do urge all citizens to join in commending the 
good works of this organization and its service to 
our community. 

Leonard J. Endres, Mayor 
City of Muenster 

Faces of 
Cooke County 

Exhibiting 

all over Texas 

and Oklahoma 

Your local home owned 
Credit Jewelers 

SEEDS JEWELERS 
307 N. Grand Village. Gainesville 

Budget Plan for Your 
BUY NOW. LAY AWAY, AND SAVE 

Diamonds -:- Digitals 

Hunt's Hay & Milo 

SEED 
Regular and Greenbug Resistant Milo 

Special Truckload Prices 

See Us Before You Buy 

M & S Dairy & Farm Center 
1529 N. Dixon 	66&7861 	Gainesville 

4 

This old tintype shows, lef to right, Mrs. Frank Schoech 
(Hulda), Joe Noggler the Schlitzenfesi King, Jennie Sieger 
the Queen and Mrs. Henry Roberg (Gusta). Mmes. 
Schoech and Roberg were "Ladies-in-Waiting" to the 
Queen and her very close friends. The three wore long 
white dresses each day. 

Mrs. Jennie Schilling, age 96, Muenster's "first" Queen 
of the "first" Germanfest. 

Choice Beef 
from our feedlot 

By the Cut or the 
Whole or Half Carcass 
Custom processed & wrapped 

... along with fryers, spare ribs, pork 
steak and roast, smoked ham and 
bacon, summer sausage, smoked 
cheese, smoked sausage, etc., etc. 

H&W Meat Co. 
Muenster, 759-2744  

Past exhibits early in the year were: 

First of Fort Worth Bank 
Irving Mall 
Forum 303 
Hilton Hotel in Houston 
and others 

The present exhibit is fn 
Downtown Library in Fort Worth 

Some exhibits to watch for: 

Hulen Mall — April 26 to May 6 
Flidgemccr Mall in the fall 
Northeast Mall in the fall 
6 Flags Mall in the tall 
Since Muensterites are such a big part of 
our business, they will be a part of these 
displays. 

Mathews Photographers 
625 N. Grand. Gainesville. 665-2431 

MAKE LUNCH 
FROM SCRA TCH 

Be a winner! 
It's easy. There's nothing to 

buy, nothing to write, nothing 
to maiL All you have to do 
is scratch. 

It's the Meal Ticket Game. 
A great Event Program now 
al the Dairy Inn. And you can 
play every day. 

Just gel your card from the 
cashier and scratch. If I. 2 
or 3 hearts appear you're a 
winner! Here's what! 

For I heart: medium drink 
or small sundae. 

For 2 hearts: banana split 
or hamburger. 

For 3 hearts: hamburger, 
fries & medium drink, or a 
meal from our salad bar. 

2nd Chance 
If you scratched and no hearts appeared. don't des-

pair. You've got a second chance to win, in the Second 

Chance Game. 

Sign your "losing" Meal Ticket Game cards and 
drop them in the boa. You'll be surprised at what you 

can win. 

Drawings at the end of each week. 

The Dairy Inn 
Phone 759-4512, Muenster 
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Custom Made Draperies 

and Bedspreads 

Finest Quality Materials 
and Workmanship 

Antique Furniture Specialists 

"QUALITY" is the Difference 

	• 

Ours Alone! 

Floating 
Diamond 
& Ruby 
Earrings 
in 14K Gold 
oy eilia  

The Ruby Stud Earrings and the 
individual adjustable Diamond 
- Floaters" combine into the most 
intriguing Earrings ever. Dia-
mond lloaters can be worn with 
your own stud Earrings too.  

Complete Diamond 8 Ruby Earring Set, $155.00 

Earrings Sold Separately: 

Ruby Stud at 
Earrings 
542.50 

Diamond 
Floaters 

$112.50 

FOR GOOD, LOW COST 

FIRE and STORM 
INSURANCE 

Contact 
Muenster Farm Mutual 

Fire Insurance Association 
Edward Endres, Secretary, 759-2905, Box 37, Muenaler 

Your local home owned 
Credit Jewelers 

SEEDS JEWELERS 
307 N. Grand Village, Gainesville 

Budget Plan for Your 
BUY NOW, LAY AWAY. AND SAVE 

Diamonds -:- DigitaIs 

Chames Fine Quality Upholstery 
1122 S. Grand Ave.. Gainesville, 665-3635 

Rambo, 
foutera 
Femeiffoes 

Gainesville's only 
pharmacy with a 
druggest on duty 

at 7:30 am. 

Open 7:30 a.m. to 8 pan. 

Wafts Bros. 
Pharmacy 

Try Our 
Professional 

Laundry and 
Dry Cleaning 

Service 
Since 1941 

GME 

CLEANERS 
401 N. Grand 

Gainesville 

equipment 
operators! 

Also 
available 
with 
steel tee 

Here's a man's boot 
every step of the way! 
Rugged, handsome, 
ready for a rough day's 
work anytime. Easy on 
the feet, too. Stop in—
try on Pecos by Red 
Wing and be convinced! 

larE°3101  
LOST 

LUGGAGE 
209 N. Commerce 

Gainesville 

O n e 40-watt fluorescent 
tube provides more light than 
three 60-watt incandescent 
bulbs, yet uses less electricity. 

-1M- 	-111- 	-11L- AIL AIL AIL 

I'M CONVINCED ... 
THIS IS REALLY GREAT 
WALL PAINT. 

It looks great when you put It On, 
and it stays that way. The colors 
match, and they don't fade or 
yellow. I've scrubbed It with 
scouring powder, and the paint 
stays put, while all the dirt marks 
1 added came off. 

I: SatinTone 1 
'IT  II 

If you want your next wall 
painting project to be last 
and easy, look great, and 
stay that way . . . try Seth-
Tone, by Colony Paints. 

... you'll like the difference! 

N ATIONAL BUILDING CENTERS 
ie-v A LONE STAR BUILDING CENTER 

• • 

Rome Care And Building Centers Nationwide 

Phone 759-2232  Muenster, Texas 

-or -or 1111- 	-lir is-  -iv-  -sr 

Fr—Get them dressed 
for Germcmfest 

at 

The Hut 

Inf.:nits to )r ✓Ms Size 20 

Boys 2.7 Wranglers 

Open dolly 105, Visa Welcome 

Lupe Evans, owner_AA 

We Carry a Complete Line of 

Hay and Forage 
SEEDS 

Bag and Bulk 
FERTILIZER 

As. 	Custom 

Spreading 

Tony's Seed and Feed, Inc. 
759-4347, Muenster 

El Charro 
MEXICAN 

FOOD 

701 Division 759.4298 
Muenster 

Next Door to Wilde Chevrolet 

Monday thru Friday 11 to 8 

Announces its 
Every Day Menu 

Nachos     $1.50 

Astro Taco 	 $1.50 
Homemade flour tortilla 

El Charro Special 	 $3.25 
1 taco, 1 enchilada, 1 chalupa, 

fresh beans and 2 guacamole chips 

Sopapillas     4 - 75c 
Fresh flour tortillas 	 doz. $3.00 
Fresh guacamole salad 	 $2.00 
Hot salsa 	_____ 	$3.00 & $4.00 

El Charro style, home made 

3 tacos  	$2.00 
Hard or soft shell 

3 enchiladas 	 $2.50 
Tamales 	 doz. $3.25 

Made fresh. Order 1 day ahead 

You can take it out 
or eat it there 

Lydia Serna, owner 

Seniors 
The Senior Class of Muen-

ster Public School held a 
clam meeting Tuesday night 
at the home of David Fel-
derhoff. They disc us s ed 
"Teacher Talk", which will be 
announced at the prom, May 
19. 

Juniors 
The Junior Class has al-

ways been responsible for 
preparing the Seniors' favor-
ite "possession, sayings, re-
member whens, and class 
prophecy." They have had 
three meetings for this pur-
pose. Their last meeting was 
held at Renee' Wilde's house, 
Monday, April 23. 

Band 
The Muenster Hornet band 

will attend the Sandy Lake 
Amusement Park, Pop Fes-
tivaL They will play several 
selections from rock or 'pop 
tunes.' 

Sophomores 
The Sophomore class is 

sponsoring a parking lot for 
Germanfest. It will be located 
on the Ben Luke land. 

let and 2nd Grade 
On Friday, April 20, first 

and second grade students 
visited the Cooke County 
College Planetarium. Mr. Dale 
Alsup of the Science Depart-
ment presented a very educa-
tional and enjoyable pro-
gram. They then went to tour 
the Gainesville Fire Station. 
From there the group went to 
Leonard Park for lunch. Vis-
iting the zoo and playing in 
the park filled the afternoon. 
Teachers and children were 
accompanied by Vickie Boaz, 
Debbie Trachta, Anne Perkins, 
Kathy Vogel, Pat Wimmer, 
Rita Russell, Sharon Walter-
scheid, Jean Park, Gladys 
Harrison, and Pat Walter-
scheid. 

Project Handclasp 
Supported by CDA 

At their regular April meet-
ing, members of the local 
Catholic Daughters of Amer-
ica voted to pledge the desig-
nated amount to "Project 
Handclasp", Sewing Machine 
fund. This is a people-to-peo-
pe program extending the 
hand of friendship overseas. 
It was established for the 
purpose of purchasing new 
and used treadle type sewing 
machines as well as associated 
sewing materials and supplies. 

One of the most important 
aspects of any people-to-peo-
ple program is to help the re-
cipients help themselves. The 
treadle type machine may be 
sent to the remotest village 
and it will operate practically 
trouble free for years. Catho-
lic Daughters of Texas are 
conducting a statewide drive 
to purchase a minimum of 
30 such machines. 

Court members also voted 
to join "Morality in Media" 
(MM). This is a non-profit, 
non-sectarian organi zation 
working to help stop traffic 
in pornography and indecency 
in Media, and to  work for 
a Media based on Love, Truth 
and Good Taste. The organ-
ization was formed, in 1962 by 
three clergymen and has 
gained nationwide recognition. 
Today, policy is formed by a 
board of directors made up 
of top-level leaders in busi-
ness, labor, the professions 
and the arts. It has launched 
an intensive Five Year Plan 
to "Turn the Tide" against 
pornography a n d offensive 
Media. 

Richard Schoechs ,  Anniversary 
A tenth anniversary party 

honored Dr. and Mrs. Richard 
Schoech of Arlington recently, 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Schoech in Irving. At-
tending the dinner party 
were Mr. and Mrs. Andy 
Schoech of Muenster, Mar-
lone and Peter Wall of Dal-
las, Karolyn and James Cooley 
and daughter, Krista of Irv-
ing. The special anniversary 
cake was baked and pre-
sented by Mrs. Cooley. Mr. 
and Mrs. Schoech spent the 
weekend with family mem-
bers. 

SNAP Birthday Honorees 
Birthday honorees at the 

April SNAP noon luncheon 
were Mrs. Ray Hudson 
(Eulice) of Myra, Mrs. Oscar 
Walter (Agnes) and Mrs. Al 
Horn (Gertie) both of Muen-
ster. A decorated birthday 
cake was sent by the Sherman 
office and was served with 
coffee. Table games followed 
during the afternoon. 

MHS Eliminated 
In Girls Regional 
Golf and Tennis 

Muenster High qualifiers in 
girls golf and tennis were 
eliminated in regional com-
petition at Stephenville last 
week. The golfers were 9th 
in a field of 16 teams with a 
score of 977 by four players 
on 36 holes. In tennis the sin-
gles entry, Barbie Wimmer, 
beat Hico 6-2, 6-4 then lost to 
Hubbard 6-1, 6-4. The doubles 
team, Brenda Wimmer and 
Karen Walterscheid lost their 
opening match 6-0, 6-4 to 
Wolfe City. 

The golf team, including 
Robin Walterscheid, Jill Wal-
terscheid, Carla Walterscheid 
and Julia Bright, missed their 
opportunity for a practice 
round and played their first 
round on unfamiliar ground. 
However they improved the 
second day beating their first 
effort by 41 points. 

Individual scores were Ro-
bin Walterscheid 131 and 119; 
Jill Walterscheid 118 and 120; 
Carla Walterscheid 141 and 
117; Julia Weinzapfel 119 and 
112. 

Team scores in the contest 
were San Saba 786, Big Lake 
804, Archer City 884, Junction 
915, Hamilton 925, Nocona 937, 
Pottsbono 969, Ranger 972, 
Muenster 977. 

Muenster High boys are at 
Stephenville this week Wed-
nesday and Thursday for their 
turn at regional golf and ten-
nis. 

Jim Biffle is the single en-
try, Todd Richey and Phil 
Wolf are the doubles entries 
in tennis. Glen Fisher, Steve 
Luke, Bob .Hamric, Dale Swir-
czynski and Vance Wells are 
the golf entries. Regulation 
permits the five to play and 
the best four scores are com-
bined for the team score. They 
play 36 holes in the two days. 

Sicking Baptism 
The baptism of Meredith 

Ann Sicking, infant daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Don Sicking 
was held Tuesday, at 8:45 
p.m. in St. Mary's Church of 
Gainesville, with Father Placi-
dus Eckart officiating. 

Baptismal sponsors were an 
aunt and uncle, Margie 
Sicking of Dallas and John 
Stoffels of Florida. Robert 
Miller of Muenster was proxy 
for Mr. Stoffels. 

Attending the church service 
and informal family gathering 
later at the Don Sickings home 
were grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. Albert Stoffels of Muen-
ster and Mrs. 011ie Sicking of 
Gainesville; also Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Miller of Muenster, 
Gloria Stoffels and Victor 
Culpepper of Ardmore and 
Carl Sicking of Gainesville. 

Next Weeks Menus 
At Public School 

April 30 through May 4 
Monday: Hot dogs, beans, 

peach cobbler, milk. 
Tuesday: Chicken fried 

steak, potatoes and gravy, 
blackeye peas, beets, cookies, 
milk. 

Wednesday: Stew, crackers, 
sandwich, cinnamon r o 11 s, 
milk. 

Thursday: Barbecue sand-
wich, pickles, onions, apple-
sauce, cookies, milk. 

Friday: Spaghetti & meat 
sauce, green beans, lettuce 
salad, cake, bread, milk 
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Mr. and Mrs. Richard Arend of Gainesville have an-
nounced the engagement and approaching marriage of 
their daughter, Barbara Susan to Glen Joseph Beyer son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Beyer of Lindsay. Father Cletus Post 
will officiate in St. Peter's Church of Lindsay on June 16, 
at 5 p.m. The bride-elect is a graduate of Lindsay High 
School, attends Cooke County College and plans to attend 
Texas Women's University. The future-groom, also a 
graduate of Lindsay High School, attends CCC and plans 
to attend North Texas State University. He is employed at 
Southland Paint Company. The couple plans to reside in 
Gainesville. 

— Photo by Mathews 
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The upper picture taken in 1930 shows, right to left the 
Muenster State Bank, A.C. Stelzer Meat Market, Louie 
Bernauer Cafe, Myrick Clinic and Drug, Farmer's Union 
Store, Cheese Plant and Hubert Wilde Garage. Present 
buildings are the Bank, Ben Franklin Store, Myrick 
Building and Library, vacant Lot and mural on AMPI 
wall, and, across the highway, the AMPI warehouse. 

--1930 photo courtesy J.M. Weinzapfel 
--Current photo by Staff photographer 

Old Fashioned German Value, 
Hospitality and Neatness 	 

LB 48* 
Instant 

NESTEA 

30z. $ 1 99  

Vienna  
Sausage 
5 0z.390  

FOOD VALUES THAT ARE 	
Specials Thru 

RIGHT N TARGET Wednesday, May 2 

PRODUCE  
Straw berries 

Pt. 49 0  
Oriiibes 

Cabbage 
5LB. °° 

LB. 1 90  CROOKNECK 

i Squash 	b. 490  

Lettuce Apples 	31Ib.. 51 00 

b Radishes 	 49° 
Ear Corn 	5s.89 0  
Celery 	stalk 49° 
Carrots 	21b.49 0  

Ha . 39° 

BEER OLDMILWAUKEE 
BOTTLES  

Coke .0.. 

Coke 32 oz. 	 

....$549 

8 for $1
09 

6 for 
$189 

Chuck Roast  LB$1 49  Fryers USDA  

Sli AC Bed BaconLB .89 c  Pear-Apple pie 

Juice 	  

320z 69° Bread 	2for89° 

TIDE 84 OZ. DETERGENT 	
 

5 2 19  
SHURFINE LARGE LOAF 

	
TK 16 OZ. WHOLE 

Tomatoes 	 4 for 1 00  

SHURFINE 

Bleach 
Gal. 48° 

JIFFY 9 OZ. 

Cake Mix 	 3fors1 00 
SHURFINE 20 oz. SANDWICH 

Cookies 	79° 

100 CT. 9 IN . 

Paper Plates 	79° 
KRAFT 18 OZ . 

B B CI SAUCE . 69 e  

Crisco 3LB $1 99  
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SHURFINE 14 oz. GLAZED 

Donuts 	 
SHURFINE 20 oz. CUT 

Broccoli 	 
PATIO 1.25oz to 16oz. ASST. 

Dinners 	 

79 i 

790  

69°  

D 
R 

G 
S 

FROZEN  
Shurfine 	 Shurfresh, Asst. 

Orange Mellorine 
1/2 Gal. 590  Juice 

6 0z.39 0  

Former Residents Send News 
Douglas and Gayle Wilde 

are now living in Floresville, 
Texas. since selling their 
home at Woodlake. They are 
building a new home in Bent 
Wood. Douglas is the son of 
Margaret Bergman Horton, 
formerly of Muenster, 

Gene and Margaret Horton 
had as their weekend guest, 
Benny Howard of Bay Port, 
Michigan. 

The Hortons received word 
from their daughters, Wanda 
and Sheila Brochu of West-
brook, Maine, that the earth-
quake shook their homes, but 
did no damage to their pro-
perty. 

Service * Courtesy * Price 

AFFILIATED  Hofbauer's 
	 Food & Locker Service 

Schedule 
of Meetings 
Young Homemakers 

Young Homemakers of Texas, 
Wednesday, May 2 in the 
Home Ec Department, MHS. 
Program on Interior Decor-
ating by Dainah Gregory of 
Newland Furniture. 

Weather's Fine 
Weather starting this week 

has been right for Germanfest 
and the community has hopes 
that the good luck will hold 
out through Sunday. Rains 
that persisted for weeks have 
tapered down to only .11 inch 
during the past week, accord-
ing to Steve Moster's record. 
Total rainfall to now is 3.42 
for April and 17.76 for the 
year up to date. 

Temperature likewise has 
been pleasant. Lows and highs 
of the week were recorded as 
follows by Moster. April 19, 
63 and 76; 20th, 64 and 76; 21st, 
60 and 70; 22nd, 57 and 76; 
23rd, 56 and 78; 24th, 57 and 
84; 25th, 63 and 86. 

Bar Association 
Invites Seniors 
To Law Day Event 

Seniors of all the Cooke 
County high schools, as well 
as any other interested per-
sons, are invited to join the 
Cooke County Bar 
Association three days of 
next week in a special obser-
vance of Law Day, which 
falls on May 1. 

Meetings in the District 
Courtroom are scheduled for 
four separate times to aviod 
crowding in the limited space. 

Hours are specified as 
follows. Tuesday, May 1, 
9:30; Sacred Heart and Valley 
View. May I, 1:30; Lindsay. 
Wednesday, May 2, 9:30; 
Gainesville. Thursday, May 
3, 9:30; Muenster, 
Callisburg, Era. 
Topics include "Do you feel 

that your rights are Disap-
pearing?" "Is there a change 
in the way the laws affect 
you?" "Are you aware that 
the law is constantly changing 
and affecting your rights?" 

Brandon's Birthday 
Brandon Bruns celebrated 

his second birthday Sunday, 
April 22, when his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Bruns en-
tertained with a noon dinner in 
their home in Garland. Guests 
were the grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Earle Otto and Mr. 
and Mrs. L.B. Bruns and the 
great-grandmother, Mrs. Ros-
alie Hoffman all of Muenster; 
also Beverly Bruns of Lake 
Worth and Theo Miller of 
Muenster. The decorated birth 
day cake, made by Brandon's 
mother carried out the Sesame 
Street theme. 

We Goofed 
We're sorry for failing to 

give credit where it was due 
in last week's issue of the 
Enterprise. Art's Studio pro-
vided the very excellent pic-

ture of the overpass which ap-
peared on the front page. 

Bitte sehr? 
May I help you? 

Your motorboat or sailboat 
is pure pleasure - but there is 
the risk of injury to swim-
mers, water skliers, and 
fellow boaters. Insure your 
boat against damage - and 
have adequate liability 

protection. Discuss It with us 
at FMW agency. 

FMW 
INSURANCE AGENCY 
OLD LINE STOCK 

COMPAN IFS 
my1•411111 SIMI Y. 11.0 

Reg. '1" 16 oz. MISS BRECK 

Hair Spray 	99° 
Reg. '1" CURAD COMIC 

Bandages 	59° 
Reg. '1" 25 Ct. 

Alka Seltzer 	 79 0  
Reg. 99' MELAMINE 

Ash Tray 	69 0  
Reg. 3 1" 14 OZ. Insulated Thermal 

Tumblers 	4for 5 1 59  
Reg. 89', 4 pack: MILKY WAY, 
3 NRISKETEERS, SNICKERS 

Candy 	79° 
Reg. '2" 10 CT. 

CONTAC 	
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Dankesreiter 
Garage 

General Auto Repair 

Air Conditioner Service 

311 DivWon St 

Phone 759-4521 

PH 759.2257 

50 

50 

25 

5c 

00 

00 

00 

00 



So, T.7N7..S.= 

THANKS 
TOYSTILATI 	or-o-fort and 

Cor=r-=- -.orty Lam-
c.a. Co. liduer..sto, 	Ste-if 

Bit-, seii, rent, with the 
Enterprise WET.: Ads. WANTED 

S grE., 	0- E ,- ,77- 
	 1,-ANEL:NS- 

LLT- fr: 
"-'n - se 

Miscellaneous 

- - 	 ft,  tat r• 

Field Cultivators 
and 

Chisel Plows 

• CASE POWER 

	

L'orect o.ir prices before 	AND ECILIZ'NENT 
yo_ dive vitt of town 	Aloe= Zmere: 

	

yolon prest-nptior_ firrati 	 655-434 
Latoumit ?no-ornoiacy. Itaemat 

• 

FOR SALE 
RAY FOR SALE: 

Inside & on 
RANGING 

▪ _ = . 	irjafe.T ■CE 
. -E.-H.-55:: Lewis Byde. 

Ein 	Gainen,Le 
2:-4 

IN STOCK 

Plumbing 

Electrical — Paneling 

Roofing — Hardware 

Water Pumps — Heating 

Air-conditioning 

We can recommend an installer 

National Building Centers 
MUETUSter 7ex. 759-2232 

■ 

STEVENS' 
FLOOR COVERING 

Geiserdie's Volvos Dealer \ 

Resistol 
and Bailey 

STRAW 
HATS 
in all sizes 

bend creased 

Jack Cheaney 
Saddle Shop 

NOW 
HIRING 

Wick Building System, Inc., 
a leader in manufactured housing, has im-
mediate openings in all shops. Previous ex-
perience not required. Excellent starting sal-
cay and company benefits. 

If interested apply in person to 

Wick Building System, Inc., 
2600 Bonneville Drive, 

Gainesville. Texas 
North of the airport 

Equal Opportunity Employer 
Male or Female 

Help Wanted 
Now a-  .7=epting applications fc,': 

dairy equipment installations 

P. 0. Box 895 -:- Ph. 668-7861 
Gainesville 

HELP WANTED 
We need ex-pens:iced help fat immediate employ- 
ment In the best equipped factory in the North Texas 
CITECL 

Paid Holidays, Paid Vacations 
Hospitalization, Profit Sharing 

JR. ELITE 
Dress Manufacturing Co. 

120 N. Sycamore, Muenster 

REAL ESTATE 

PAZ s1 	A.PRIT 
	

/471:13"5-rilY. 	. 

((CtlISSIFIEEI ADS sure to get results)) 

- 	• - 	 : 7.7,7 
- • - 

1,1u.ng 

° • 	an t_..-iner 	tt 
Saat,a.r.er Wate,leat 

Stn=dt ? D. 
Erti. 	 7624tr 

772—E. New and 
t_t 

▪  

,imetitat For estrinate 
tt_ l-leaschead. 753-423G, 
2.6,1711,.-77 

 
it 

F-L7r-S EIR SALE : Pot  
- • 

0,ntact 
:, 'a-  Eirta, at Ls, Tea-. 

Detr. Phone 763--27611. 
za-2 

FOR SALE 	t=i t-it art 
pot-ta -ole darirraa,nent. 
lent trondttror, Rest Furrutin-e. 
713-4451 	 23-2 

Books Books Books 

30,000 
tines two-,,eriratta bock 

• 

Book Rack 
and Thimble 

6654445 
"" 

• Y Tessa 79240 

MOTORS. all  sizes, Ice 
milking machismo. water 
grunge. Aerrootor equipment, 
ete. 

NATIONAL BUILDING 
carrots 	Bad 

Buy. se:- rent, with the 
Enterprise Want Ada. 

Johnson Motors, MonArk 
and Tideoraft Boat., Parte 
and Accessories. Sales and 
Serv.a. Gainesville Marine, 
K I-Lc:way 82 phone 668- 
7462 15-tf 

LET US ADD Central Heat 
and Air Conditioning to your 
borne National Building Cen-
ter, 753-2=2 Muntstn. 46-11 

SALES 
and 

SERVICE 
Billy Bob Ps. 7,11 

Formerly 
PeisonaLly Farr 

PHILLIPS SALES CO. 

neWelItennezar-- 

Carpen. Vinyl. Tile 

Cuaom Drapes 
Wan Coverangn 
Carpet Cleaning 
Fabric Notions 

end Petteras 

Modern Floors 
& Fabrics 

r.z N. Matz, 759-2843 

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies 

Structural Steel 
and Pipe 

Complete Line 
of Bolts and 

Miscellaneous 
Hardware 

Metal Sales, Inc. 
On Highway 82 

west of Gainesville 

N 	 

New Kirby 
VACUUM 

CLEANERS 
209 W. Cala, 665-2542 

Hudgins 
ais,errttl• 

GLASS: Plate, window, 
mobile, furniture tops. our, 
Complete :Men service_ 

an dle ineurance claims. 
Gainesville Glass Shop, 609-
p21. 311 N. Cbwrtiout. 97tf 

I Want Ad- in -- nt Reel-11U 

eneleneenal 

Sewing Machine Repairs 
All makes & models. In our 
store or in your home- 

Jake Gehrig. 759-4112 lltf 

FOR SALE: Cemetery M013- 
=eats. all sizes. Reasonably 
priced. See J. P. Flusche or 
phone 759-n05 or 753-2203 

48-t1 

FOR SALE: Waterless 
Cookware. Home Demonstra-
tion kin cL Unopened. $175. 
Regularly $400-500. Phone I- 
817-365-1375. 21-4 

KIRBY
_...._.....,........___.„ 

K rk  

Vacuum Cleaners 9 • 

SINGER ::; 
Sewing Machines 

$99.50 up 

Sales Sr Service 
835 E. Calif.. 665-9112 

Gainesville 

See Jan Cain for 
MARY KAY 

products 
Free Facials 

Call 7 59 2746 

C & C 
Swap Shop 

I.e Pew Location 

Red Barn 
W. Hwy. 82, Gainesville 

Lane selection of used furni-
ture, appliances, collectable., 
critiques, baby items. 

Open 10-6 Closed Sundays 
BUT . BELL - TRADE 

665-3247 

Water Pumps 
err _.e 

it,?. to 40 14-P. 

Plastic Pipe 
A yen-  Inerpenasve 
aLyto gf.1 water 

ccc von need it 

NATIONAL BUILDING 
CENTERS 
Mnenster 

Read 
Grain Bins 

1533, 1830. 2!00. 3190 
end 2"06 bushels 

17 	 .77.=ediate 

e=r- 	7 77es-table  

WiI-O-Mac 

PROTECT YOU arid your 
!souse w-nita you sleep. Smoke 
alarms available at CoMMILD-
Ay Lumber Company. 37-H 

Gainesville 

CALL CAROLYN WAL-
TERSCHEID FOR MARY 
KAY COSMETICS, 759-4128. 

Call 
Dan Luke 

759-2522 
FOR 

FINA GAS 
FINA OIL 

FINE DIAMONDS 
WATCHES. JEWELRY 

WATCH REPAIR 

ROESLER JEWELRY 
Muenster 

SAVE 
On utility bills by adding 

blown in INSULATION. 
See Or call Tony Element 

or National Builcting Centers 
759-2232 	27-ti 

SEWING MACHINES 
VACUUM CLEANERS 

STEREOS, TAPES 
Records IS Accessories 

SALES 4. SERVICE 
ALL MAKES 

Hudgins 
209 W 	, Gainesville 

Phone 665-2542 

Australian Cattle Dog Pup-
pies. Registered Queenland 
Blue Heelers — males — fe-
males. Excellent workers. 
companions. watchdogs. Tele-
phones 1-713.440-3916 or I-
817-382-5747. 16-8p. 

We sell and install 
propane tanks and 

equipment 

SCHILLING 
Propane Service 
753-25.D5 	P.O. Box 535 
Muenster. Texas 7e252 

CONCRETE WORE: Any kind 
cc a concrete jcb or furnish 
ready mix cin =ea_ Bayer 
Ca-a, etc. fit! 

WRANGLERS 

Shoes — Boots 
Work - Dress - Western 

Nocona Boots 

J. R Hocker 
Men's & Sops' Store 

227 N. Commerce. Gainers-21e 

FOR RENT 
MOBILE HOME for rent 2 

bedroom. fully fm-nished, a 
block from school on N. Wal-
nut. Ph_ 759-2268, Jerome Pa-
gel 16-tf 

—C.V.,' LEASING 

U-Store and Lock 
Mini Storage 

759-4212 
514 E. 1st St., Muenster 

SERVICE 
Real Estate Wei= 

Bonded real estate broker 
qualified to act ae agent for 
sales or rentals. 

Henry G. Weasapfel 
759-2257, Muenster State Bank 
7594161, 630 Weirocandel Si, 0 

WC's 
ELECTRIC SERVICE 

Weldon Chris Muller 

Fully Insured 

Specializing in 
Oil Field Service 

CALL DAY OR NIGHT 
Shop: 759-4517 

Home: 726-3613 
Mobile: 668-8591 

(Unit 416) 

P.O. Box 541 
Moonier. Tx, 76252 

23-6 

wrli do yard work, mowing 
pruning. cleoeieg, etc. Jim 
Vogel 759-2757, 21 If 

LAWN MOWER REPAIR 
Straighten shaft, sharpen 

blade, adjust or overhaul mo-
tor. Dick Dittfurth .  7594154, 
02-61 

PLUMBING 
Installation & Repair 

Residential & Commerical 
FIXTURES, SITPPLJES. 
McDonald Water Pumps 

Robert Russell Plumbing 
759-4155 

	

Muenster 	31-tf 

Dozer Service 
Call or See 

Frank Hess 
759-4249 

ELECTRIC MOTOR 
SALES 6 REPAIRS 

Oil Field Wiring 
SERVICE CALLS 
Ditch Trenching 

Cl Radio Installation 

Muenster Electric 
759-2581 or 759-4831 

G re H Sankt.. 
& Dump Truck Service 

Herman Grewing, 
Bernard Hesse 

Sewer Systems 
on Field & Industrial Work 

Ph. 759-4130 or 759.4304 
Mobil Ph. 759-4812 

Automatic trans serv. 
and overhaul, spin wheel 
balance, air cond, sera., 
auto-truck-tractor acre. 
and overhaul, brake and 
electric eery. 

Bob's Auto Berne. 
759-4474 

Office Help War::: 
experience needed to 
trained Apply in person. 
Wilde Chevrolet Co., 759-2261 

IMIT 'WAN! 	L. V. N. 
for 3 to 11 &Ht. St. Richard's 
Villa. Nue-ater% 759-2219. 23-2 

Need a steady babysitter 
from 3 p.m. to 11 p.m. in my 
home for two children Call 
St.   via 719-22:9 
ask 7:7 F.. 77 E7.7 

American 
Land Rush 

50 acres west of Era, along 
highway 922, 12 minutes from 
I. 35, a great way to start the 
good life. Three bedrooms, 
two and one half bath modern 
brick home will make some 
country gal mighty pro _ 
Arranged to entertain in to 
spacious game room. Plenty 
of land to run horses and cat-
tle. Priced at $135,000. 

45 acres, four and a half 
miles southeast of Gainesville 
with a little bit of everything. 
Trees, open spaces. creek, 
spring-fed pond (ahould never 
run dry) home site high on a 
hill overlooks small valley. 
Privacy plus. Priced at $800 
per acre. 

NEW HOMES 2, 3 and 4 
bedrooms. Priced $27,000 to 
$55.000. 957, financing avail. 
able. Shag carpet, fireplace. 
ash cabinets. Frazier & Rodg-
ers Construction Co.. 665-5343, 
1299 N. Grand, Gainesville 

HELP wAyrsn. 11 p.m_ 7 
a-ce. Aide or Medication Aide- 
Yes-ter-Year, Inc. Saint Jo 
995-2650 or 995-2302 	18-tf 

Help Wanted in the Parts 
Department- Also need per-
son for part or full time shop 
help. Wilde Chevrolet Co. 19-tf 

Des Cafe, Now Wiring: 
Cooks and waitresses. Come 
s..-y Del's Cafe in Saint Jo or 

23-rf 

329 Acres 
Cooke County 

4 ini. NE of Muenster 

acre private lake 
deep water well 

r";a cultivation balance 
native grass 

Owner financing 

Earl Fisher 
Box 307 

Muenster. Tee, 76252 
817-759.2257 

- , 

	 • 

Good Buys in 
Real Estate 

Commercial building, down-
town Muenster. Brick con-
struction. 50 ft. it 100 ft. plus 
storage. Parking area. Owners 
terms, paced very reasonable, 
good investment. 

411 acres East of Muenster, 
farm and ranch land. 

164 acres West of Muenster. 
farm and ranch land.. 

50 acres West of Muenster, all 
in pasture. 

Don Flusche 
Real Estate Broker 

759.2832 
Operational 62 cow dairy 

w/6 stall barn on approx. 177 
acres. 3-2 brick home and 2-I 
frame house. 2 hay barns, 
tractor & equipment, imple-
ment shed, steel pens. 2 stock 
ponds and much more. Town 
& Country Real Estate, 
1209 N. Grand, Gainesville, 
665-0419 or 665-2641. 12-tf 

SAVE FUEL COSTS 
witb loniln,iea .tor IZ wain and Sniveled.. 

Inquire at 

NATIONAL BUILDING CENTERS 

7s9-22sa 

-,-=.,_=.ernial Or ner- 
tonal 1.an-4. Or. theckialg at' FOR YOL-R HOME: steel 
mania. Saving Accounts. Safe vinyl and 
Deposit Box e s. Travelers National Building C enter,  
Checks Collection and Ex- 54,,,, as.ter. 	 z2,41 
change, Ihavecin Semite and 
24 hour depository. 
NICKVSTER STATE BABE 

A full Seer-see Bank, 
Member F.D.LC. 

Backhoe 	Track Loader 

Dump Truck 

Fill Sand 	Septic Systems 

Driveways, Lease Roads, 

Land Clearing, General Escalating 

Gcnnesvalle 

ALLEN R FLFJTMAN 
301 N. Grand, 668-7716 

Gainesville 
23-1 

OSBORNE HAWKINS 

presents the 

Werar311111...r, 

14■11111001111d  
Will buy, sell, trade 
or appraise all types 

of real coral. 

ALLEN A FLEITMAN 
Office (817) 668-7716 
Home (817) 726-3298 

301 N. Grand, Gainesville 
23-3 

Re; 
R 
Rpc, 



DAN BOONE'S 

After Easter 

SALE 
April 26-27-28 

One group 

Dresses & Pant Suits 
One rack 

Ladies' Shoes 
One rack 

Men's Coveralls 
One rack 

Men's Sport Coats 
One table 

Men's Pants 

All 1/2 Now Price 

Reg $195 

Roll Top Desk . $155.00 
Reg. $513, 2 pc. velvet 

Living Rm. Suite $41 1.95 

  

Charge it on 

your Master Charge 

 

  

    

Daniel Boone Discount 
995-2103, Saint lo, Tex. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hopfer 
and Greg of Saint Louis spent 
the Easter holidays here with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Mosman and in Gaines-
ville with his parents, Mr. and 

Rodney Hess Wins 

Mrs. Joe Hopfer. Joining 
them on Easter Sunday was 
Father Jerry Mosman, pastor 
of St. Mary's Church in Hen-
rietta. 

--- 

In Poetry Contest 

e 
et 

clorY 

1!stl 
lug' 
im 

2 
Town  
too 

ossimmm■.*  

Texaco 
of Nocona 

ANNOUNCES 
That they are now equiped 

to do all types of 
Radiator Repair Work 

Bill's Texaco 
600 E. Hwy 82 LiimmilimmiwNocona, Texas 825.4921 

Births 	Pageant Planning Finalized by ESA 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Black of 

Myra are parents of a daugh-
ter, Donna Faye, born in 
Muenster Memorial Hospital 
on Friday, April 20 at 12:50 
a.m., weighing 5 lb. 131/2 oz. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. James Eckart of Muen-
ster and Mr. and Mrs. David 
Black of Myra. The great-
grandmother is Mrs. John 
Eckert of St. Richard's Villa. 
Donna Faye is a baby sister 
for Danny, Paul and Connie. 
Mrs. Bill Black is the former 
Rose Eckert. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Fetsch 

of Laramie, Wyoming an-
nounce a daughter, Madelyn 
Diane, born on Sunday, April 
22 at 6:17 p.m. weighing 8 
lbs. Her grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Fetsch of 
Muenster and Mr. and Mrs. 
Alvin Benke of San Antonio. 
Mrs. Robert Fetsch is the 
former Lu Benke. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Rhett Bald-

win of Forestburg announce 
the birth of a daughter, Amy 
Gayle, at Muenster Memorial 
Hospital on Monday, April 
23 at 4:52 a.m., weighing 8 
lb. 41/2 oz. Grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. William Robert 
Landers, Jr. of Fort Worth, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob McCurdy 
of Haltom City and Mr. and 
Mrs. Lloyd Baldwin of 
Euless. The great-grandpar-
ents are William Robert Lan-
ders, Sr. of Forestburg, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ret Latta of Rock-
ford, Ill. and Mrs. Ruby Fry 
of Fort Worth. Great-Great-
Grandfather Mertzer lives in 
Iowa. Amy Gayle has two 
brothers, twins Rhett and 
Robert. Mrs. Rhett Baldwin 
is the former Robbie Lan-
ders. --- 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Lester of 
Era are parents of their first 
child, a daughter born Tues-
day, April 24 at Flow Hospit-
al, Denton, at 9:30 a.m., 
weighing 7 lb. IS oz. Her 
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Bruno Fleitman of 
Muenster and Mrs. Bede 
Lester of Gainesville. Mrs. 
Don Lester is the former Sara 
Fleitman. 

Among visitors who came 
especially to meet the new 
niece and cousin are Sara's 
sisters, Mrs. Theresa Jo Mc-
Crimmon of Denver, Colo. 
and Mrs. Janie Cox and her 
children, Kelly, Kevin and 
Kris of Houston. They are 
guests of parents and grand-
parents, the Bruno Fleitmans. 

The Muenster CB Club at-
tended the April 19th meeting 
of the Myra Community Im-
provement Club. The pro-
gram included discussion of 
Germanfest and the club's 
participation. 

Muenster Milling Company, Inc. 
'The Feed People-Serving The North Texas Area Since 1947" 
• Liquid Feed • Dry Feed • Veterinary Supplies • Wire-Twine 

"Specializing In High Quality Dairy Feed" 
"We Buy Grain" 

• Drying & Storage Facilities Available 

817-759-2287 Muenster, Texas 

TEXAS FARM BURE 
OFFICIAL MEMBERSHIP C 

THIS CERTIFIES THAT 

L.,  

• 

JOHN O. FAR:152., 

ROUTkr-1--J  

FARMV1LLE;  FTEX' 700 
1/4454Alfella OF 

 FARM BUREAU 

t9,5 h-tr.7 	reo O 

This Card 
Entitles You to 

S
Pu
A
r
F
ch
E
ase  
MARK

,  

tires and batteries. Another service-

to-member program offering a quality 

product at low cost. 

FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION, CONTACT 

Knabe Tire and Radiator 
305 N. Main, Muenster 

759.4141 
IRE SURE TO HAVE YOUR MEMBERSHIP CARD WITH YOU) 

Final planning for the Miss lation which wi 	be held 
Muenster Pageant were made 
by mmbers of Beta Kappa. 
ESA, Muenster, Texas, at the 
April meeting in the home of 
Liz Howe. Beta Kappa Schol-
arship Award entries were al-
so presented and a student 
from each school was selected. 

Plans were completed for 
the observance of ESA's 50th 
anniversary the first week in 
May and the May 8th Foun-
ders Day Banquet and Instal- after the meeting. 

jointly with Kappa Theta 
Chapter of Gainesville. 

Loretha Cash, president for 
1979-1980, presented her agen-
da for the year. Loretha's 
theme for the year is "Educa-
tion in Love and Charity" and 
her officers presented their 
goals in keeping with her 
theme. 

Liz Howe, hostess, served 
a lovely buffet before and 

HAPPY HOUR 
Tuesday thru Friday 

25c DRAFT 
4 to 6 p.m. and 

all night Wednesday 

Thursday Night Special 
Veal Parmigicma 	 $3.25 

Friday Night Special 
Fried Catfish   $3.95 

All you can eat 

THE CENTER 
Restaurant & Tavern 

East Hwy. 82, Muenster 
CLOSED MONDAYS 

* * * * 	* * * * * * * 

Visit Our Booth in the Park 
during the 

GERMAN FEST 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Anheuser-Busch 
Hospitality Coach 

will be in Muenster for Germanfest 

and the Fun Run 

Courtesy of 

Gilbert Endres Distributor 

and Anheuser-Busch, Inc. 

Budweiser * lit1501 	 kriere/(lQw 	 Pf,/, 	w   

• twrirtf.:, 
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Electric Co-op Meeting 
Resorts Continued Growth 

Mrs. Bill Becker of St. 
Richard's Villa joined a family 
gathering in the home of a 
granddaughter and family, the 
Lennie Haverkamps for an af-
ternoon visit and the evening 
meal. Mr. and Mrs. Herbert 
Hundt of Dallas spent Easter 
Day in the Haverkamp home 
with their daughter's family 
and went to St. Richard's to 
bring Mrs. Becker to the gath-
ering. 

COMPLETE 

MN-MAL 

SERVICE 

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home 

Collection Set for 
St. Jude Hospital 

Members of Beta Kappa 
Chapter of ESA will accept 
donations for the benefit of 
St. Jude's Hospital in a church 
door collection after all 
Masses Saturday, April 28 
and Sunday April 29. 

The hospital, in Memphis, 
Tennessee, founded in 1962 by 
Danny Thomas, is world re-
nowned for research and 
treatment of children's can-
cer and other catastrophic 
diseases. It is supported sole-
ly by funds from volunteer 
contributions. The Texas 
membership of ESA, always 
a generous contributor, is 
appealing for cooperation in 
the drive to raise funds for 
the St. Jude Hospital. 

Lose Weight 
Safely 

with Dex-A-Diet Tablet. 
Only tic et 

WATTS BROTHERS 
Gainesville 

A continued increase of 
both kilowatt sales and the 
number o f consumer mem-
bers for 1978 was reported 
by General Manager Mike 
Sloan at the annual meeting 
of Cooke County Electric Co-
operative Monday night in the 
Muenster Public School audi-
torium. 

He outlined some of the, 
problems that the co-op is 
facing, especially inflation. 
"As a result of the energy sit-
uation and inflation" he said, 
"your cooperative must deal 
with problems that are per-
haps among the most difficult 
of any we have ever had to 
deal with. Like you, we are 
spending more for less ma-
terials, and in the case of line 
extensions and line improve-
ments, we are spending more 
to build them and are receiv-
ing less kilowatt hour sales 
from them than we have in 
past years." 

Sloan outlined the action 
being taken by the Brazos to 
meet future energy needs, 
which includes a lignite coal 
fired generating plant expec-
ted to be operational late in 
1980. Also in 1981, Brazos is 
expecting to receive a small 
part of the output of the 
Comanche Peak nuclear plant 
being built by Texas Utilities 
near Glen Rose. 

Mr. Sloan concluded his 
comments by thanking the 
co-op directors for their guid-
ance in the past year, the em-
ployees for their dedication 
and loyalty, and the consum-
ers for their cooperation. 

In the annual election of 
directors, Billy Farr of Dis-
trict 2 and Vincent Zimmerer 
of District 4 were re-elected 
by acclamation for three more 
years in office. Their names 
had been placed in nomina-
tion by Al Trubenbach, chair-
man of the nominating com-
mittee. 

Following the meeting the 
directors held their annual or-
ganizational meeting for the 
next year. They chose Vincent 
Zimmerer their new president  

to succeed Jack Crownover 
who had served 21 continuous 
years in the office. Other of-
ficers are Robert Lewis, vice 
president, and Wendell Prof-
fer, secretary-treasurer. Other 
directors are crownover, Farr, 
Pete Skinner and Jimmy 
Jack Riffle. 

Speaker of the evening was 
Jim Morris of Austin, general 
manager of Texas Electric 
Cooperatives. He brought an 
entertaining and informative 
address that was enjoyed by 
everyone. 

The evening's program open-
ed with registration and mus-
ical selections by the Has 
Beens, a western group from 
Gainesville and Lake Kiowa. 
Father Denis Soerries gave 
the invocation, President Jack 
Crownover made the intro-
ductions and Secretary Wen-
dell Proffer read minutes of 
last year's general meeting. 
The business meeting was fol-
lowed by the annual drawing 
for attendance prizes and ad-
journment was followed by 
serving coffee and cookies by 
members of the Muenster 
FHA chapter and their ad-
visor, Joni Sturm. 

Lucky winners of attend-
ance prizes were Andrew 
Fleitman, Charley Hellman, 
Virgil Hess, August Felder-
hoff, Kenneth Hacker, Bruno 
Fleitman, Gerald Walter- 
scheid, Billy Joe Dangelmayr, 
Norbert Klement, Charles 
Davidson, Paul Fetsch and R. 
M. Davidson, all of Muenster; 

Waylan Van Zandt, Marvin 
Rauschuber, W. J. Witt, Doro-
thy Kyle, Margaret Wise, 
Winston Fangman, Erwin 
Fuhrmann and John Arend, 
all of Gainesville, 

E. C. Holt, J. W. Malone 
and C. R. Strutz of Lake 
Kiowa; Roy Pollock and Ray 
Durham of Nocona; J. E. Tay-
lor and William Hermes of 
Hood; C. R. Young of Saint 
Jo; Brent Holtandsworth of 
Callisburg; D. H. Shults of 
Forestburg; Viola Durham of 
Capps Corner, and L. E. 
Blades of Dallas. 

Rodney Hess, son of Mrs. 
and Mrs. Pat Hess, a 6th 
grader at Sacred Heart School 
and student of Sister Chris-
topher, was awarded the Jerry 
Simpson Memorial Award for 
a poem he submitted in the 
creative writing contest spon-
sored by Cooke County 
College. Rodney was the first 
place winner in his age group, 
Middle School, and received a 
trophy and $30 cash award. 
Title of his original poem was 
"Noisy Cat." 

Greg Walterscheid, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Sylvan Walter-
scheid, an 8th grader and 
student of Mrs. Tommy Feld-
erhoff, Jr. won 2nd place in 
the poetry contest. His title 
was "Learning." There were 
20 entries from SHS in the 
poetry and short story divis-
ions. 

The awards presentation was 
held on April 19 at CCC. Scott 
Chisolm of New York was 

the guest speaker. Most of the 
6th grade attended, accom-
panied by Sister Christopher 
and Mmes. Pat Hess, Albert 
Hess, Sylvan Walterscheid, 
and Harvey Schmitt. 

Rodney's poem follows: 

"Noisy Cat" 
The cat that cries at night, 

Really isn't very nice. 

He whines at night 
for canned food — not mice. 

If he gets hungry enough 
He'll tear down the door 
crack the window and 
smash the floor. 

But someday he'll understand 
He'll pay the price 
At the end of my hand. 
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In All 
The World 
No one Is more 

understanding or 
more guallbed 

to serve you. 

"Lirispsiol 
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1 0% OFF 
ON ALL 

FAMOLARE® 
SHOES 
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Selected Group of 

FAMOLARE® 50% 

Spring must really be here weekend in New Braunfels 
for good as we spotted our visiting with Ross' sister and 
first scissortail this past week family - Mr. and Mrs. 
and also the mockingbirds are Conrad Zuschlag and their 
back with us. Was told that children. 
spring is here when the Scis- 	--- 
sortail arrives. 	 Mr. and Mrs. Tolbert Fan- 

ning of Abilene, Mr. and Mrs. 
The Annual Ex-Student Ban- Steve Fanning of Garland and 

quet on Saturday night April Sally Fanning of Buffalo, New 
14 at the local school has been York spent Easter Sunday at 
termed a big success with over the Tolbert Fanning place at 
300 Ex-Students and their Stoney Point. 
families attending. 	 --- 

Billy Dee Hill of Dallas 
visited with his sister Mrs. Ola 
Mae Shults and son Dale 
Friday night April 13. 

- -- 
Mrs. Lillie Tinney and 

daughter Pat and Mrs. Christ-
ine Winningham of Boyd visit-
ed in the V.G. Greenwood 
home recently. 

--- 
Mrs. Dorothy Richardson of 

Irving visited with Mrs. Mabel 
Covington Friday April 13. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Orrell of Tex-

arkana and Buster Orrell of 
Seattle, Washington spent the 
Easter Holidays with Mr. and 
Mrs. Willie Orrell and other 
relatives. 

--- 
Leona Smith, Mr. and Mrs. 

Grady Reed, and Alaveree 
Massey of Euless and Henry 
Don Monroe of Dallas visited 
with Mrs. Lenora Moore 

- -- 
Tracey Lanier, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. Gerald Lanier, 
celebrated his 10th birthday on 
April 9 with his home-room 
classmates - 3rd and 4th 
grade students, and his teacher 
JoAnn Greenwood. Tracy's 
mother, Mrs. Olita Lanier and 
grandmother Cleo Lanier ser-
ved refreshments at the cele-
bration. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Hoyt Mann of 

Dallas visited her parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Campey over 
the Easter weekend. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Sirman of 

Miami, Texas and Mr. and 
Mrs. 011ie Sirman of 
McAlester, Oklahoma visited 
with Mrs. Minnie Sirman on 
Easter Sunday. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Ross Littell, 

Stoney Point, spent the Easter 

Ali ons t 
CITY 

Muenster 

COUNTY 

Cooke 

STATE 

Texas 

ZIP CODE 

7 6 2 5 2 
STATE BANK NO. 

1400  

FEDERAL RESERVE DISTRICT NO. 

1 1 

CLOSE OF BUSINESS DATE 

March 31, 1979 

ATTENTION! 
LITTON Microwave 

Cooking School 
Everyone Invited ... Men & Women 

See The Litton Counter Top Microwave Ovens 

And Combination Range In Action 

And Taste The Results 

See all the models with all the features 

WHERE: 

Cooke County Appliance 
406 East California, Gainesville 

WHEN: 

Thursday, May 10, at 7 p.m. 

HOW:  

Call 759-4411 for Reservation 
Space Is Limited 
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Forestburg News by 
Myrt Denham 

during the Easter Holidays. 
--- 

Garland Kuykendall visited 
with his parents the Willie 
Kuykendalls the weekend of 
April 14. 

--- 
Recent visitors in the Calvin 

Greenwood home were Mr. 
and Mrs. Bobby John Green-
wood and son of Chico and 
C.S. Greenwood of Park 
Springs. 

- -- 
The United Methodist Wo-

man's Group of the Forest-
burg United Methodist Church 
met in the home of Mrs. Betty 
Reynolds at 2 p.m. Wednes-
day April 18. President Mrs. 
Lucille Littell opened the 
meeting. The program for the 
day was on Loneliness / 
Aloneness in which all present 
participated. Those attending 
the meeting besides the hostess 
were: Mmes. Lucille Littell, 
Alice and Esther Shears, Betty 
Scott, Cleo Lanier, Decie El-
lzey, Marion Sockwell and 
Myrt Denham. Following the 
program a short business 
meeting was conducted after 
which there was a period of 
fellowship with delicious re-
freshments served by the host-
ess Mrs. Reynolds. 

- -- 
Mrs. Mary Hays accompan-

ied daughter LeAnn and 
Doniece Steadhom to the Re-
gional U.I.L. Prose Reading 
in Abilene Friday April 20. 

--- 
The District 4-H Method 

Demonstration was held in 
Denton Saturday April 21. 
Karen Bell placed 5 in clothing, 
Janice Lanier and LeAnn 
Hays took 4th in Home Envir-
onment, Jeff Lanier and Nan-
Traylor placed 1st in Com-
munity Improvement. Mrs. 

Save Money! 
Save Time! 

Prescription Is Our 
Middle Name. 

Shop the 
Drive-in Window 

for all your prescriptions 
and drug needs. 

WATTS 
Prescription Shop 

302 N. Grand, Gainesville 

Mary Hays, 1st and 2nd grade 
teacher at Forestburg, was a 
judge in Natural Resources. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy (Ted) 

Jackson motored out to Mat-
ador and Floydada Friday 
April 20 to visit with their 
daughter Mrs. Ouida McCan-
less and Todd. The Don and 
Darrell McCandless families 
of Floydada and the W.R. 
Terrell family of Post. The 
Jackson's granddaughter 

atoni Dill accompanied them 
they all returned home late 

unday April 22.- 

Mrs. Mrs. D.D. Echols is still a 
patient in the Muenster Hos-

ital. 
Harry B. Perryman was tak-

en to the Bethania Hospital as 
of late Thursday afternoon 
April 19. He is doing very well 
and hopes to be home real 
soon. 

Bailey Perryman, Wichita 
Falls has returned home after 
being a patient in the Bethania 
Hospital since April 10 when 
he suffered a heart attack 
during the tornado. Bailey is 
the brother of H.B. Perryman 
and Mrs. Millie Reynolds. 

--- 
Word reached the Forest-

burg area Tuesday a.m. April 
17 that Mrs. Bob Stallworth of 
Amarillo had passed away ear-
ly that morning. Mrs. Stall-
worth was a sister to the late 
Mrs. Mae Landers. She was 
Ina Barkley before she mar-
ried Mr. Stallworth who is the 
son of the late Mr. and Mrs. 
Ed Stallworth. Bob Stallworth 
is the cousin of Mr. Millie 
Reynolds, Mrs. Marion Sock-
well and H.B. Perryman of 
Forestburg and Mrs. Joe 
Denham of Bowie. 

A man is just as big as the 
thing that makes him angry. 

Mr. and Mrs. Noble Coker of Saint Jo and Bill Qualls of 
Lafayette, La. announce the engagement and approaching 
marriage of their daughter, Shelta Jenise Qualls to James 
William Ivins, Jr. both of Saint Jo, Texas on Saturday, 
May 26 at the First Baptist Church of Saint Jo. Parents of 
the future-groom are Mr. and Mrs. James W. Ivins of Fort 
Worth. The bride-elect is a 1978 graduate of Sacred Heart 
High School of Muenster, and is attending Cooke County 
College. Jim Ivins is a graduate of Saint Jo High School 
and attended Cooke County and Tarrant County Colleges. 
He is the owner and operator of Jim's Grocery and Locker 
in Saint Jo. The couple will reside in Saint Jo. 

All friends of the bride and groom are cordially invited to 
attend the wedding and reception.  

Tony Fleitman Is Birthday Honoree 
Anton Fleitman's birthday 

was observed with a family 
party all day Sunday. Guests 
arrived for the noon dinner, 
visiting during the afternoon, 
and remained for the evening 
meal. 

Attending were Mr. and 
Mrs. Eugene Fleitman and 
family of Muenster, Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Hermes and family 
of Lindsay, and Virginia, 
Theresa, Agnes, Alfred, Nancy, 

Scouts Work on 
Germanfest Booth 

The April 23 Boy Scout 
meeting of Troop 664 featured 
assistance by Merit Badge 
Counselors Herman Carroll 
and Butch Fisher. Mr. Carroll 
gave help and guidance as the 
Scouts worked on their First 
Aid merit badges. And Mr. 
Fisher aided them in setting up 
their booth at Germanfest and 
in arranging for the sale of 
soft drinks, popcorn, snow 
cones, cotton candy, and Ger-
manfest button, pennants and 
hats. Booth profits will help 
the scouts go to Summer 
Camp. 

They also worked on their 
Citizenship Merit Badges. In 
one designated hour, the boys 
gathered a large amount of 
aluminum cans and sold them 
for $17.85. 

Bob Michaels is Scout-
master. Scribe and assistant 
scribe are Duane Walterscheid 
and Darren Walterscheid. 

DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 

301 E. Broadway 
865-3521, Gainesville 

If no answer call 
885-2452 

Catholic 
Life Insurance 

Union 
National Old Line 

Life Insurance 

Cancer Fund Insurance 

Pat Knabe 
Representative 

Bt. I. Box 149 
Muenster, Tex. 

759-2888 
enanallsatasPeleSsieWn001110•111 

Susan, Karla and David Fleit-
man of the home. 

Joining them in the after-
noon and the evening were the 
honoree's sister and brother, 
Mrs. Anna Jostwerner and 
Andrew Fleitman. Birthday 
gifts and family and group pic-
tures added to the afternoon. 
The cake was baked and de-
corated by the daughter-in-
law, Mrs. Eugene Fleitman. 

CONSOLIDATED REPORT OF CONDITION 
(Including Domestic Subsidiaries) 

LEGAL TITLE OF BANK 

2a 

ASSETS 

1. Cash and due from depository institutions 	  
2. U.S. Treasury securities 	  
3. Obligations of other U.S. Government agencies and corporations 	 
4. Obligations of States and political subdivisions In the United States 
5. All other securities 	......................... 
6. Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell 	. 	. • 	 
7. a. Loans, Total (excluding unearned income) 

b. Less: allowance for possible loan losses 
c. Loans, Net 	........................... 

8. Lease financing receivables 	  
9. Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises 

10. Real estate owned other than bank premises 	  
11. All other assets 
12. TOTAL  ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru 11)  	  

LIABILITIES 
13. Demand deposits of Individuals, partnerships, and corporations 
14. Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations) 
15. Deposits of United States Government 	  
16. Deposits of States and political subdivisions In the United States 	  
17. All other deposits 	  
18. Certified and officers' checks 	  
19. Total Deposits (sum of Items 13 thru 18) 

a. Total demand deposits 	  
b. Total time and savings depoSits 

20. Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase 	 
21. Interest-bearing demand notes (note balances) Issued to the U.S. Treasury and 

other liabilities for borrowed money 	  
22. Mortgage Indebtedness and liability for capitalized leases 	  
23. All other liabilities 	  
24. TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures) (sum of items 19 thru 23) 
25. Subordinated notes and debentures 

EQUITY CAPITAL 
26. Preferred stock 
27. Common Stock 	  

28. Surplus 	  
29. Undivided profits and reserve for contingencies and other capital reserves 
30. TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 26 thru 29) 	  
31. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 24, 25 and 30)  	 

MEMORANDA 
1. Amounts outstanding as of report date 

a. Standby letters of credit, total 
b. Time certificates of deposit in denominations of $100,000 or more 	 

c. Other time deposits In amounts of $100,000 or more 	  
2. Average for 30 calendar days (or calendar month) ending with report date 

a. Total deposits (corresponds to item 19 above) 	  
NOTE, This report must be signed by an authorized officer(s) and attested by not less than three directors other than the Nicer(s) signing the report. 

I/Vie, the undersigned officer(s) do hereby declare that this Report of Condition (including the supporting scheduled is Ira to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE OF OFFICERS) AUTHORIZED TO SIGN REPORT AREA CODE/TELEPHONE NO. 	DATE SIGNED 

	

817-759-2257 	 April 18, 1979 A 	 - 

NAME AND TITLE OF OFFICER(S) AUTHORIZED TO SIGN REPORT 

John D. oeurer, Cashier 

State of 	TEXAS . 	 Co tnty of 	CV:ME , 	 so: 

	

.Sleorn to at d subscribed before me this 	 day of 	 • 	 19 	79  
and I hereby car ify that I am not an officer or director of this bank. 
My commission expires 	Dec.. 	 19 80  	:%.„:81,.4-4-&-ei.,X.riteoroy  Public. 

Cooke County Appliance 
406 East California, Gainesville 

Mil. Thou. 

2 
1 

a. No. shares outstanding 
a. No. shares authorized 
b. No. shares outstanding 

None 
1,000 
1,000 

We, the undersigned directors, attest the correctness of this Report of 
Condition (including the supporting schedules) and declare that It has 
been examined by us end to the best of our knowledge and belief has been 
prepared In conformance with the instructions and is true and correct.  

SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR 



 

MEN 
SHAPE UP NOW! 

 

Classes for men will be starting again May 1, 
1979. Call now, classes will be limited. 

NEW TIME FOR MEN- 
6:30AM till 9:30AM and 7:30PM to 10:00 PM 

 

2 for 1 SPECIAL FOR MEN 
Who Sign Up 

Now Through May 1 
Two can sign up at the same time for 1 month for only $50.00 

 

    

NU-U HEALTH CLUB INC. 
Locally Owned 8 Operated by Rugh Jacobs 8 Vino Mc Culioy-Co-Owners 

312 North Commerce 	 817-665-3414 

Ben Brown, 
Plant Superintendent. 

Dennis Hess Named 
On NFIB Council 

Announcement was made 
today of the appointment of 
Dennis J. Hess of Hess Fur-
niture Co., as an Action Coun-
cil Member to the National 
Federation of Independent 
Business (NFIB) in San Mateo, 
California and Washington, 
D.C. 

N 7'IB is a non-profit, non-
partisan organization repre-
senting the neec's of small 
businesses across the country. 
Founded in 1943, it was de-
signed to promote the concept 
of free enterprise and to give 
independent business a great-
er voice in shaping the laws 
which govern business and 
government. 

The idea of the Action 
Council Member was devel-
oped by NFIB President Wil-
son S. Johnson, who felt the 
need for members to take a 
more active role in furthering 
the cause of small and inde-
pendent business at the grass 
roots and federal level. 

Public School 
Jr. High Banquet 

The Junior High Recogni-
tion Banquet for Muenster 
Public School will be held 
Thursday, May 17, in the 
school lunchroom at 7 p.m. 
The P.T.O. is the sponsoring 
organization. 

NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT 
TO: AU Persons Interested In 

the Estate of WANDA F. PAL-
MORE. Including its creditors (It 
any): 

Take notice that on the 16th 
day of April. 1979. Charles Pal- 
rnore. Post orrice Address: 307 
Rosedale, Gainesville. Tex., was 
appointed Independent Executor In 
Cause No. 10,763 styled. Estate of 
WANDA F. PALEMORE. DE- 
CEASED now pending on the 
docket of the County Court of 
Cooke County Texas. 

At persons als anise claims 
against the abOVe estate shall pre- 
sent the same within the time 
prescribed by law. 

SIGNED: Charles alma e, In- 
dependent Executor of the Estate 
of Wanda F Palmore. Deceased 

23-1 

Muenster 
Livestock 
Auction 

SALE EVERY THURSDAY 

We offer our 

service to assizt you 
in buying or selling 

of live stock. 

Bill & Mike Hamer 
Phone 759-2201 

7 

ntonio 3 

ITALIAN FOODS 

Finest Home-cooked 
Italian Meals 

Hot and Cold Subs 
Call-In-Orders for 

Even Faster 
Lunches and Dinners 

Dining Room Available 
for Private Parties 

ITALIAN FOODS 
'1207 N. Grand in Grand Plaza, Gainesville 

1 block south of Wal-Mart 
665-0191 

SAVE 
On Farm and Ranch Supplies 

CFI Baler Wire 

Hybrid Sudan 

Milo 

Oil, Grease 

Fertilizer 

Tires 

Grain Bins 

Red River Farm Co-op 
1300 N. Dixon, 665-4338, Gainesville 
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Pc  The Musiaue Shoppe 
105 N. Dixon, 86 -0391, Gainesyll e 

Financing Available 
from Pacific Finance 

FREE LAY AWAY 

BROADWAY 

0 earned as follows. 

4 	High jump: Monte Endres 
3rd; 	Bert 	Hesse 	4th; 	Brian 
Herr sth. 

Shot put: Joe Bartush 2nd, 
Paul ul Bartush 5th. 

Discus: 	Joe 	Bartush 	2nd; 
Paul Bartush 5th. 

Polevaut: Jeff Hess 3rd. 
G Long 	jump: 	Brian 	Bednorz 

THE 
MASQUE 
SHOPPE 

CALIFORNIA  51 

COURT I 
	 RANI[ 

...c1,D CA," C7,,d 	 CO-p-d eer-"°' A SH Wins Three Divisions of 

-.c7a 	 e,ta._Co-so 3rd ; Brian Hess 5th. 

Plus Live Entertainment 
for your pleasure 

The Musique Shoppe will furnish a new 
Kimball piano for use at the pavilion 

during German fest, 

Come See Us 
at the Germanfest 

And see our super buys 
on Pianos and Organs 

	

1i 	Sacred Heart won three out 	100 yd. dash: John Hartman 

g of four divisions of the TOIL 2nd; Joe Bartush 5th; Phil 
'1( district track meet at Amar- Walterscheid 6th. 

	

a WO during the past weekend, 	220 dash: Dick Dangelmayr 

A 
and came out a strong second 2nd; John Hartman 5th. 

	

in the other division. In spite 	440 dash; Dick Dangelmayr 
of a very impressive team 1st; Stuart Wolf 6th. 
score of 159, the varsity boys 880 run: Jeff Hess 1st; Bert 

9 were nosed out by Christ the Hesse 4th; Jesse Walterscheid 
A King of Lubbock. The three 5th. 

	

winning counts were: Varsity 	Mile run: Dale Schilling 1st; 
girls 204, junior high girls Gary Henscheid 3rd; Bert 
189, junior high boys 173. 	Miller 5th. 

	

To sweeten the record, the 	120 hurdles: Brian Bednorz 
A Tigers will be represented in 2nd; Dean Swirczynski 5th, 

13 events and the Tigerettes Monte Endres 6th. 

	

in 12 at the state track meet. 	330 hurdles: Brian Bednorz 
Qualifyers, who won either 4th. 

	

first, second or third, or par- 	440 relay: Sacred Heart 2nd, 
ticipated in first, second or Brian Bednorz, Joe Bartush, 
third relay wins, included the Phil Walterscheid, John Hart-
following boys: Joe Bartush, man. 

	

Dick Dangelmayr, Jeff Hess 	Mile relay: Sacred Hleart 

q
and Brian Bednorz, each 3 2nd, Bert Hesse, Dale Schill- 
events, Monte Endres, John ing, Jeff Hess, Dick Dangel-

a Hartman and Dale Schilling, mayr. 4  each 2 events; and Phil Wal- 
VARSITY GIRLS terscheid, 'Bert Hesse and 

Gary Henscheid High jump: Tammy Hen- 

	

q 	 ' each one 	 

Tammy Hensche

event. 	 ld and Lisa scheid 3rd, Linda Krahl 5th; 

Girls who qualified are Donna Trubenbach 6th. 
ZO 	 Shot put: Sharon Grewing  

Hennigan, each 4 events; Len-  2nd;  Virginia Bartush 4th; 

da Krahl and Sharon Sicking, Jannelle Hellman 6th. q each 3 events; Shellie Wal- Discus: Sharon Grewing 1st; 

rs  terscheid, Donna Trubenbach Virginia Bartush 4th. 
,' and Sharon Grewing each 2 Triple jump: Sharon Sick- 

events; and Lisa Krahl, Rose ing 4th.  

q Sharon Voth and Diane Cap- 

	

Felderhoff, Virginia Bartush, 	Long jump: Donna Trunen- 
bath 4th; Diane Caplinger 5th. 

	

linger, each one event. First, 	100 yard dash: Shellie Wal- 
terscheid 3rd; Donna Truben- Elsecond and third place win- 
bath 4th; Lisa Krahl 5th. d 	

Varsity Boys 

ners are eligible for state. 
220 yard dash: Shellie Wal- 

terscheid 2nd, Lisa Hennigan 
Points by Tigers were 3rd; Rose Felderhoff 5th. 

440 dash: Lisa Hennigan 
1st; Sharon Sicking 2nd; Lin-
da Krahl 3rd. 

880 run: Tammy Henscheid 
2nd; Sharon Voth 3rd; Angie 
Bartush 5th. 

Mile run: Diann Caplinger 
2nd; Nancy Sicking 4th, Jen-
nelle Hellman 5th. 

1 

"GENERATING PLANTS LIKE THIS 
ARE ONE OF THE REASONS THE COST 

OF ELECTRICITY HAS GONE UP. " 
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Texas Power & Light Company 
spent more than $225 million during 
1978 to construct generating plants 
which use lignite coal and nuclear 
materials as fuel. This is a continu-
ing program, begun in 1971, to 
phase out use of expensive 
natural gas. 
Even though the cost of electricity 
has gone up, TP&L is making prog-
ress in keeping the cost as low as 

possible. For example, in 1978, 
lignite-fueled plants saved the aver-
age residential customer $55.00 on 
his electric bills. As more and more 
power is produced with lignite, TP&L 
will pass the savings on to all of its 
customers. 

Texas Power & Light dependable 
electric service throughout North, 
Central and East Texas for more 
than sixty-six years. 

TCIL District 
880 relay: SH 1st; Shellie 

Walterscheid, Tammy Hen-
scheid, Linda Krahl; Lisa 
Hennigan. 

440 relay: SH 1st; Sharon 
Sicking, Lisa Krahl, Rose 
Felderhoff, Donna Truben-
bach. 

Mile relay: SH 1st, Sharon 
Sicking, Tammy Henscheid. 
Linda Krahl, Lisa Hennigan. 

JUNIOR HIGH BOYS 
High jump: Ricky Hennigan 

2nd; Curtis Henscheid 3rd. 
Shot put: Ricky Hennigan 

2nd, Mike Bartush 3rd. 
Discus: Joe Hennigan 2nd, 

T. J. Walterscheid 3rd. 
Pole vault: Darrell Herr 1st. 
Long jump: Darrell Herr 

4th. 
100 ydy. dash: Ricky Hen-

nigan 1st. 
220 yd. dash: Ricky Henni-

gan 1st; Darrell H. 4th; Jim 
Bartush 5th. 

440 yd. dash: Greg Walter-
scheid 5th; T. J. Walterscheid 
6th. 

880 yd. run: Darrell Herr 
1st; Wade Walterscheid 5th; 
Jim Bartush 6th. 

Mile run: Mike Dangelmayr 
1st; Ronnie Dangelmayr 2nd, 
Greg Stoffels 5th. 
60 yd. hurdles: T. J. Walter-
scheid 4th; Curtis Henscheid 
5th; Greg Walterscheid 6th. 

100 yd. hurdles: Wade Wal-
terscheid 2nd; Curtis Hen-
scheid 4th. 

440 relay: SH 2nd; Mike 
Dangelmayr, Curtis Hen-
scheid; Leroy Voth, Jim Bar-
tush. 

Mile relay: SH 1st., Mike 
Dangelmayr, Wade Walter-
scheid, Ricky Hennigan, Dar-
rel Herr. 

Danko! 

Thank You 

Hornets Track 
Muenster High varsity was 

number 3 in the District 14-A 
track meet at Allen last week, 
and it qualified three mem-
bers to participate in the re-
gional meet next week at 
Stephenville. 

David Felderhoff will be in 
the 880 run, Carl Pagel in the 
shot put and Kevin Klement 
in the high jump. Each took 
second place in his event at 
the district meet. 

Pilot Point ran away with 
the meet with a huge total of 
193 points, Celina was sec-
ond with 89 and Muenster was 
third with 67. Other team 
scores were Callisburg 37, 
Lindsay 29, Pottsboro 25, San-
ger 24, and Aubrey 19. 

In the two junior divisions 
the Muenster teams were sec-
on last . . . junior varsity 
with 30 and junior high with 
9. 

Team scores in JV were 
Aubrey 139, Pottsboro 124, 
Pilot Point 80, Celina 75, 
Lindsay 35, Muenster 30, San-
ger 14. In junior high they 
were Pottsboro 170, Pilot 
Point 79, Sanger 78, Celina 62, 
Aubrey 60, Lindsay 32, Muen-
ster 9, Callisburg 6. 

Muenster Varsity's points 
were earned as follows. 

440 relay: MHS 6th, 47.4, 
Robert Weinzapfel, Gary Kle-
ment, Tim Hermes, Todd 
Richey. 

880 run: David Felderhoff 
2nd, 2:02.4, Gary Zimmerer 
5th, 2:07. 

120 hurdles: Kevin Klement 
4th, 15.9, Todd Richey 6th, 
16.3. 

440 yard dash: Gary Kle-
ment 6th, 54.2. 

330 hurdles: Gary Klement 
5th, 42.6; Todd Richey 6th, 
43.6. 

220 dash: David Felderhoff 
4th, 23.6. 

Mile run: Eddie Serna 4th, 
4:53.5; John Zimmerer 5th, 

Mile relay: Muenster 3rd, 
3:35, Gary Klement, Gary 
Zimmerer, Kevin Klement, 
David Felderhoff. 

Pole Vault: Tim Hermes 
3rd, 11'. 

High jump: Kevin Klement 
2nd, 6'; Floyd Felderhoff 5th, 
5'10". 

Shot put: Carl Pegel 2nd, 
51103/4". 

For All Your 

Travel Needs 

Come See Us 

Associated 
Travel Agency 

Is Still Located at 
THE TWINER HOTEL 

MI E. Calif. St. 
Gainesville 

817-665-4191 
817.665.1794 

TEXAS POWER & LIGHT COMPANY 
A tax-paying, inventor-owned electric utility 

Weldon and Doris Crow of Nocona announce the en-
gagement and approaching marriage of their daughter 
Suzan Crow to Ted J. Endres, son of Mr. and Mrs. Ray-
mond R. Endres, Jr. of Muenster. The bride-to-be is a 
1972 graduate of Prairie Valley High School and a 1975 
graduate of Cooke County College. She has been employ-
ed by Nocona General Hospital and is currently enrolled in 
Cosmetology at Cooke County College. The future 
groom, a graduate of Sacred Heart High is employed by 
Burk Royalty in Gainesville. The wedding will be held on 
Saturday May 26 at Bethel Baptist Church in Nocona at 7 
p.m. 

— Photo by Mathews 



Bacon Ends 
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Sliced Bacon 
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Smoked Links 
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Hot Dogs 
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Corn Dogs 

Turbot Fillets 

Vinyl Playballs 
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 Baby Lotion 
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Baby Powder 
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Gatorade 
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Pea. Butter 
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Inst. Coffee 

Coffee 
RAGA VOL 

Spaghetti Sauce 
DRUM 

Salmon 
GLADIOLA 

Flour 

Liquid Liquid 
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Junior Garden Club Organized by Muenster Club 
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Easter Sunday was a "Big 
Day" for residents of St. 
Richard's Villa. The Easter 
Bunn) kept popping in with 
flowers and gifts from various 
groups and organizations. 

Mrs. Betty Race Walter-
scheid baked. decorated and 
delisereii a beautiful cake in 
the Easter theme. 

A sing-song fest in the after-
noon. climaxed the celebrat-
ion Music was furnished by 

Easter Guests 

Mmes. Alice Walterscheid 
and Janet Fisher. with assist-
ance from Mrs. Betty Kleiss 
brought Easter baskets to resi-
dents of the Villa on Saturday, 
the day before Easter. The at-
tractive baskets contained 
cookies and candy. The three 
ladies represented the Muen-
ster chapter of Young Home-
makers of Texas 

The Muenster Junior Garden 
Club is the first such organ-
ization in this area, the first in 
Cooke County and the nearest 
Junior Garden Club is in Den-
ton. This is the distinction of 
the group sponsored by the 
Muenster Garden Club and 
organized in the Fall of 1978. 

Its first meeting was a Nature 

Hike. The members collected 
various materials to be used on 
the covers of their yearbooks. 
They took note also of any in-
sects, birds, trees, butterflies 
and wild flowers they saw. 

During the November 21 
meeting, the members made 
yearbook covers which were 
later judged by the Muenster 

Garden Club. Kim Hess won 
first prize. 

December meetings included 
a tour of Aughtry's Flowers in 
Gainesville, learning the iden-
tity of many greenhouse pants 
learning why cut flowers must 
be kept cool and being 
gifted with an African Violet 
to care for at home. On Dec-
ember 12, members made 
Christmas tree favors of pine 
cones and other natural mater-
ials, as gifts for their "adopted 
grandparents" at St. Rich-
ard's Villa. 

January activities included 
planting of periwinkle seeds 
and daffodil bulbs in pots for 
later transfer to the Myrick 
Play Center. Also making of 
posters for the Youth Com-
munication Poster Contest. 
Local winners were, in order 
named, Janel Flusche, Deanna 
Bierschenk and Sondra 
Hughes. 

During February meetings 
they studied about bluebirds 
and painted bluebird houses 
for placement in the com-
munity. 

On March 27, pre-started 
bulbs and seedlings were set 
out at the Myrick Play Center. 
resulting in already thriving 
daffodils and periwinkles. 
Members also cleaned and 
raked the Mini-Park area. It 
was announced that posters 
sent to the District II meeting 
of Texas Garden Clubs won a 
2nd prize for Deanna Bier-
schenk, a 2nd prize for Janel 
Flusche and an Honorable 
Mention for Sondra Hughes. 

Bluebird houses were placed 
about the community on 
April 10 and the nature circle 
study was resumed. Major 
April activity will be assisting 
with clean-up week prior to 
Muenster's Germanfest. 

In May, the Junior Garden 
Club will exhibit projects and 
awards at the installation of 
Muenster Garden Club of-
ficers for 1979-1980. 

There are 17 members in the 
club, all second graders at Sac-
red Heart School and Muen-
ster Public School, including 
Kim Hess, Kim Bayer, Janel 
Flusche, Noelle Hesse, 
Michelle Walter, Deanna Bier-
schenk, Start Sicking, Lisa 
Hamric, Sondra Hughes. 
Jeannene Walterscheid, Jen-
nifer Carroll, Kristie Fette, 
Cheryl Bayer, Laurie Fisher, 
Jennifer Gam and Michelle 
Robertson. 

Assistance has been provided 
by Laura Flusche and Carmen 
Flusche and by adult leaders 
Mrs. Harold Flusche and Mrs. 
August Felderhoff. Members 
of the sponsoring Muenster 
Garden Club and the fresh-
man class of Sacred Heart 
High School have also 
assisted 

YOU CAN 

BANK 
ON IT! 

Most of our depositors 
put their money in the bank 
as a place of safekeeping. 
They are wise! Deposit 
credits cannot be lost. They 
cannot be filched. extorted. 
or stolen. And if a clever 
penman successfully forges 
your signature. it is the 
bank. not the depositor. 
who takes the loss. 

But the deposit function 
if the bank does more than 
lust provide a place of safe-
keeping for your money. 
When you deposit funds. 
you actually help finance 
the economy. Your funds 
are joined with the surplus 
funds of other depositors. 
Including not only other 
individuals but also 
businesses a n d govern-
ment-, This pool of surplus 
funds does not remain idle. 
Through the lending 
operations of the bank, 
these funds finance the 
activities of industr y. 

agriculture, and govern -
ment. The more depositors 
the bank has the more 
funds it has available for 
!ending. the greater the 
lending power. the greater 

he economic advance. 
Your deposits make it 

- You can BANK 

Ars. Ekvbby-e Hefner of Am 
take. The cake w as served 

arillo and Fred Pogue of Gain .. 
Wah WY cream to the honorer, 

esvtlle. 	
-- 	

residents and guests. Every- 
joined . in singing the 

Reeve A. Cooke celebrated ?, ne  
HaPPY,  Birthday Song... his 89th birthday twice. On 

C 
Thursday April 5 the Cros:' 

Reeve coke is a true pioneer. 

Timbers Band entertained a 	Mrs. Jennie Schilling of St. 
the party and on Thursday Richard's Villa joined a family 
April 12, Mr Cooke'. gathering in Lindsay on Easter 
daughter Lou Nell Miller an Sunday, in the home of a 
his granddaughter. Barbar granddaughter and family, the 
Vcn.iblc brought birthdayi Weldon Bezners. 
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Hunt's Tomato Sauce 
Vienna Sausage - 
Nestea Instant Tea 

BAR-13.71SAUCE 
tog. att. Swett& 
Wes tits, frit ■ Imes 690  

180z. BTL 
SF. EN SEAS - YeEA- 

Dressing 	 69 
Ir AsE1 

!iamb. Dills ".„;-; 89' 

Scott Towels 	69' 

Gladiola Mixes 	5,001" 

Spray Cleaner  . 	89' 

FROZEN FOODS DEPT, 	< 

Cooking Bag 	3 

Cheese Cake 

Morton 
T.V. 

Dinners 
Asst. Selection 

56 0  

;y-j... Burrito 	 3,0.s1°° 

Colby Cheese 	tet1  sl" 

BTRTArl.i. BISCUITS 	3 1Lt  'V° 
> 	FINE QUALITY MEATS 	< 

Pork Roast 	 s '1" 

> 	FRESH DAIRY FOODS 	< 
ALEX 5 OZ ASST 

WE WORK HARDER... 
TO MAKE YOU HAPPY 

AT FISCHER'S 

WHEN YOU RE IN A MURRY AND NEED FAST 
CHECKOUT SERVICE WE HAVE WHAT 
YOU WANT 

VARIETY 	SERVICE 	AND QUALITY 

We re WT. Your Food Store Really Ought To Be 

SWIFT LEVI I TEMA 1111$111 HIT 
$ Pork Steak 	la 1

29 
 

GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

Boneless Chuck Steak 	 sl" 
GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

Boneless Swiss Steak 	 . 199 

GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

Arm Roast 	 L.1 5 ° 

 

Golden Harvest 

Canning 
Lids 

3 ,0  1 00 

Crisco 
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Valencia 

Oranges 
LBS.S1 00  

FANCY 

Arizona 

GRAIN Fp 

BLADE  
HEAVY 
	U T 

Chuck 
Roast 

1 39 

LESS 
FAMILY PACK 

Ground 
Beef 

49 
L 

TOTINO'S 
PIZZA 

Hamburger. Sausage 
Canadian Bacon, Peperoni 

or Cheese 

'1" 

seat fltarkrt 
Butch and Johnny Fisher 

AFFILIATED 
gla 	  

on it! 

Muenster 
State Bank 

blitionCiae, Taos 

Member F.D.LC. 

Ff 



30 YEARS AGO 
April 22, 1949 

Muenster will vote May 7 on 
5300,000 bond issue for new 
public school building. The 
John Fettes and Emil Vogels 
celebrate golden wedding an-
niversaries. Reburial is held 
here for Paul Streng, 23, vic-
tim of war Jan. 4, 1945 in 
France. Allen Hoffman and 
Billy Whitt enter district con-
test on range management. 
Jerry Fette cracks bone in 
right wrist in a fall at Saint Jo 
skating rink. A daughter, 
seventh girl in the family, 
arrives for the Ted Neus. 

Gulf 
Gasoline, OIL 

Supplies 

For Your 

Farm Needs 

Jimmy Lehnertz 
Gulf Distributor 

665-4562, Gainesville 

Or see local dealer 

Ford's Gulf Station 

GMC  

Pickups, Vans 
and Trucks 

Any size 
2 and 4 wheel drive 

Come and See Them 

We're Ready to Trade 

Hoedebeck GM C 
759-4366, Muenster 

Attention Fanners & Ranchers I 
Free Removal of Fresh Dead 
or Disabled Horses and Cows 

Call Collect 817-665-0763 
Call as soon as possible for prompt service 

24 hour service 	 7 days a week 

Gainesville Stock Removal Co. 
2 miles east of Gainesville on Highway 82 

New modem facilities . . . Clecm sanitary trucks 

What does it take 
to feel secure? 

1. A place to hang your 
hat. 

Actually it's much more 
than a place to hang-up Or 
hang-out. Ifs where the heart 
is, and whether a castle or a 
cottage, there's lust no place 
like home 

2. A chicken in every 
pot. 

In most cases, one 
chicken and one pot are 
sufficient. Unless, of course, 
you have a very large family. 
Then, a turkey in the pot is 
even better. Best of all — a 

brother in the grocery 
business 
3. First Texas Savings. 

Security is more than 
peace of mind. It's a plan of 
action — designed to meet 
your needs today, and grow 
with your goals for tomorrow. 
And a savings plan at First 
Texas Savings can really help, 

Our Regular Saving 
Accounts earn at the rate of 
5.25% and keep your money 
readily available. Your account 
begins earning interest from 
the day of deposit. And, at First 
Texas, your interest also earns 
interest every day. to increase 
your annual yield. 

For longer term 
investments at higher interest 
rates, Certificates of Deposit 
are ideal. Here too, First Texas 
gives you the benefit of 
earnings from day of deposit 
and daily compounding of 
accumulated interest And you 
can choose from a variety of 
different terms and rates, 

Certificates of Deposit*  
Anmal 	Mnrnion OFmvn 	Arms] 
Fete 	Tenn 	Dewar 	trek, 

Of course, your savings 
can be insured safe, up to 
$40,000 for single accounts, to 
$200,000 for couples, and to 
$560,00 for a family of four by 
the Federal Savings and Loan 
Insurance Corporation. And 
First Texas Savings makes it 
easy and convenient to save 
too. With services like 
postage-paid Save By Mail, 
direct deposit of Government 
Checks, Checkmatic money 
transfer to simplify loan 
payments, and Readi-Check. 
to put idle checking account 
funds to work, earning for you 

Why not get all the details 
fro,-n a First Texas Savings 
Counselor? It's the smart way 
to get your savings growing. 
And get the confidence that 
comes with real financial 
security. 
Federal regulations require a substantial 
penalty for early withdrawal .  

Savings Association 

Gainesville Office: 
101 East Broadway Street 
Gainesville (76240) 665-3484 

Muenster Office: 
510 East Division Street 
Muenster (76252) 759-2283 

575% 
650% 
6 75% 
750% 
7 75% 
80% 

3-Months 
Year 

27a Years 
4-Years 
6-Years 
8-Years 

$ 500 
$1 DM 
$1.000 
at an 
Sian 
$1 .000 

5 92% 
6 72% 
6 98% 
779% 
8 06% 
833% 

Certificates above are automatically 
renewable unless the Association gives 
written notice of cancellation at least 15 
days prior to the maturity dale Earnings 
:try compounded daily and paid quarterly 

'  Federal regulations require a substantial 
;)cnally tor °only wilhdrawal 
Annual yield based on accillilllialed 
ua ^ nest nl tine vr•: Home office Dallas Mrsolier FSL IC 
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It i sn ' t I f 	 it in one 
woman  hata foal, dreads 
when he thinks of marrying 
—  separating himself From 
all the others. 

One thing about the good 
old days —  if you bought a 
horse you could be pretty 
sure that the model wouldn't 
change nest year. 

IT HAPPENED 
40 YEARS AGO 

April 21, 1939 
New booster pump for water 

system is installed by city; 
traffic light is next. K of C 
initiation to be held here May 
7 will be known as "Father 
Francis Class". Muenster En- 
terprise and REA co-op will 
share new building on which 
construction will start in July. 
Garden Club sets May 8 a 
date for Golden Jubile 
Flower Show. 	Mrs. J.P. 
Klimp, 62 dies. Dorothy Fette  
will represent Muenster as 

Gainesville 
Ford Tractors 

Jim Zimmerer 
665-6791, Gainesville 

ELECTRICAL 
CONTRACTING 

Fixtures 
Supplies 

Residential, Commercial 

and Oil field Wiring 

Installations, Repairs. 

Appliance hepalrs. 

Call 665-2721 
Nights call 

665-3263 or 1165-445S 

Parker Electric 
112 S. Rusk. Gainesville 

Caroline Streng are married 
Monday. Richard Wilde and 
Clara Lutkenhaus are married 
Tuesday. 

35 YEARS AGO 
April 21, 1944 

Teddy Gremminger wins 
third prize on 4-H Club hog at 
annual County Junior Stock 
Show. Voth lease south of 
town changes hands — Monte 
Standiforth sells to C.J. Bon-
ner of Wichita Falls. Shorten-
ing goes off war ration list. 
Adolph Herr and Meinrad 
Stoffels pass army physicals. 
Sgt. Joe Bezner, on leave at  

25 YEARS AGO 
April 23, 1954 

Overflow crowd attends first 
service in new Sacred Heart 
Church for Easter Resurreo 
tion ceremonies. Parish 
honors Rev. Joseph Weinzap• 
fel following first solemn Mass 
Wednesday — the 25-year-old 
son of Mr. and Mrs. J.M. 
Weinzapfel was ordained in 
Dallas Monday. Relatives 
from here attend silver wed-
ding celebration of the Frank 
Walterscheids in Hereford. 
Mrs. J. S. Horn attends Sun-
day dsurch saviors for the first 
time since she broke her hip 
almost four years ago. Sacred 
Heart students win four out of 1 
five top spots in state-wide U. 
S. Treasury-sponsored poster 
contest. Joyce Wiesman is 
new president of local FHA 
Chapter. 

20 YEARS AGO 
April 24, 1959 

Death claims two pioneer 
residents, Ben Sicking and John 
Tempel. Muenster is host for 
district meeting of North Tex-
as State League Sunday. Fritz 
Stoffels dies in Kerrville. 
Henry Weinzapfel gets real 
estate license. Kathy Pagel 
earns homemaking degree. 
Bobby Hess, 14, breaks leg in 
baseball game. Martin Bayers 

April 24, 1964 
Number change announced 

for Muenster fire alarm ... 
now it's 2235. 	Jack Biffle 
home at Myra and all contents 
are destroyed by fire. Relat- 
ives attend Sister Ruperta's 
funeral in Nebraska. 	City 
council appoints James Polk 
as swimming pool manager. 

New 	telephone directory 
shows growth of Muenster 

Telephone Corp. 	C.N. 
Worley, 78, Montague County 
pioneer dies. Virginia Taylor 
gives private piano recital. 
Rain of .64 inch brings year's 
total to 8.77 inches. Joe 
Lehnertz is dismissed from 
Dallas hospital after major 
surgery. Thirty-five are in 
Lindsay First Communion 
class. Progress is made in 
forming hospital auxiliary. 
Sharon Klement and Billy Don 
Wolf marry. New arrivals: 
boys for the Erwin Fuhrmanns 
and Tommy Hesses; girls for 
the Pat Stelzers and Henry 
Fleitmans. 

J.S. Horn, first operator, who 
died a week before the book 
was distributed. Final rites are 
held at Lindsay for Mrs. John 
Neu, 96. Robert Haverkamp 
is home on vacation from 
Africa job. Mr. and Mrs. Mat 
Neu celebrate golden wedding 
anniversary at Lindsay. New 
arrivals: boys for the Dolphy 
Joe Hellmans and Ray W. 
Bezners. 

5 YEARS AGO 
April 26, 1974 

Scoutmaster Wilfred Reiter 
i s Jaycee selection for Out- 
standing Citizen of the Year at 
annual awards banquet. Silver 
jubilee events will honor 
Father Placidus Eckart Sun- 
day. Cancer Crusade here nets 
$456 in church door collect- 
ions. Shamburger's new name 
is National Building Centers. 
May 8 is set for next Blood- 
mobile visit. Dallas Cowboy 
Billy Traux will be speaker at 
SH awards banquet. Co-op 
members hear report of big 

year, over 700 persons attend 
annual meeting. Drought is 
broken by 2.91 inches of rain. 
Nigeria exchange student is on 
job here to learn car repair. 
Newlyweds R o b e r t 
Haverkamp and Miss Toba 
Kheafi Darabi of Iran marry 
here and fly to Iran to make 
home. Golden Years Club re-
organizes with large attendants. 
First Communion services are 
held Sunday for CCD class. 
Kin and friends join to cele-
brate Mrs. Bob Yosten's 90th 
birthday. Surprises greet Wer-
ner Clers on 30th wedding an-
niversary. Christi Koester and 
Leon Klement marry. Pilot 
Point hosts quarterly meeting 
of NCCW. New arrivals: boys 
for the Tommy Corcorans and 
Rickie Gastons; a girl for the 
Frank Schillings Jr. 

Flood: A i.. 	t.. 	for 
its bridges .  

WIMMER 
DIESEL 

SERVICE 
Truck and 

Tractor Repairs 

East Hwy. 82 
759-2560 

IR1?2,22 1,  

ti 
Laundry & 

Dry Cleaning 

ti 

 ry 

WE 
GIVE 

Miller Cleaners 
329 N. Commerce 

665-3301, Gainesville 

dutchess at Gainesville Circus Lindsay, says the morale of 

Roundup — Pat Stelzer will be fighting men in Cassino is 
duke escort. Muenster Hatch- high. Heard from in letters: 
try breaks all former records, Captain Francis Zimmerer in 
this year District picks An- the South Pacific, Arthur Fel-

selma Pagel as outstanding derhoff, Great Lakes Naval 
actress in one-act play con- Training Station, Illinois, Her-
test. Frank Schilling and man Stoffels, Camp Carson, 
	  Colo. 

10 YEARS AGO 
April 25, 1969 

Mrs. J.S. Horn, 93, resident 
here 79 years, dies. City trims 
$25,000 from sewer warrants 
issue. SH 4-H clubbers win in 
district and advance to state 
contests. Clifford Sicking is 
first in hurdles event at region-
al meet. City Park gets im-
provements in Jaycee project. 
Time arrives to advance 
(clocks. Evelyn Hess and 
Jerry Hennigan marry. 

;ITwenty-one seventh and eight 

graders are in speech tourney 
It at Dallas. Frank Walter-
ischeids of Hereford celebrate 
40th wedding anniversary. 
Louis Sicking breaks left leg 
above knee in oil field acci-
dent. Anniversary Telephone 

celebrate silver wedding anni- Directory is dedicated to Mrs. 
versary. 	The Jesse Sanner 

 

family moves to make home in 
Cross Plains. Judy Lutken-
haus is elected new FHA 
Chapter president, 

15 YEARS AGO 

... Drapery Cleaning 
with decorator fold 

... Certified Cold Storage 

... Bridal Gown 
Preservation 

.. 

.. Repairing 

. Alterations 

We specialise In 

Ladies' & Men's Knits 

041kG1 

 SO°  BIG 17.7 CU. FT. 
CAPACITY... HI-EFFICIENCY HOTPOINT! 

USES LESS ELECTRICITY THAN 
OUR STANDARD HOTPOINT MODEL! 

0 Rolls out on wheels0 Revers- 	Model CTF18GY 
ible door 	3 Easy-Release l " 
ice trays and bucket 0 See-thru 	

$ 499 vegetable and fruit bins 0 3 • 
Door shelves 	 Jun 
	  Save S40 

Icemaker Kit, Just 5 50 
with this Refrigerator-Freezer 

Save '19 

115 S. Commerce, 665.6861, Gainesville 

• 
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Fob Dube, The lbw 
Breed for 79 Annaransant 

at the ion net 
new boos ca. =gm-4-c..o .,ne 

effluent Oempins of ant  caf 
nao buel .n America In 

area 3 -doco mode,' 

FAIRMONT (.Bra 2.3 ens  •nflu•) $238 OFF! 
Includes2 3 Lrtre Engine ✓ myl Roof Exteror 

Decor Group IninflOr Accom Group Tu-Tone  Pam ,  
Treatment 

GRANADA (.51, 250  CID  •nwnb $220 OFF! 
Inctufle.  250  CO Engine acts.,  Pam? 'niece 
very,  Roof  Bodywde Moldno Ten. Wneel 

Coven Deluxe  Ehnp•. Group ens Du& soon 
men.. 

SEE THE MOST EXCITING NEW CARS OF THE YEAR 

FLITURA (mta 250 CIO  imam.) $238 OFFI 
Includes 2 3 Lan. Engine. amyl Root (raw 
hattI W,Oe PodyeKle moldove• vent vinyl Ineerta 
Pere WNW Covers Deluxe Bumper Group and 
Flip-up  Open-A, Roof 

OW  ,4% OFF STICKER PRICE OF SPECIAL OPTION 
PACKAGES ON EXPLORER PICKUPS 

UP TO 
Oa DISCOUNT 

Include, Metal. Pam, Culniren  inn%  Pec•oup• Low-Mount Watem Moors 
Cowan.,  0.4 Wneel Cobb Brger VwfutOnela  Of b  and Backlwnt 

E•alown Nom) Ornament. Color -Keyed F-0-R-12 /Albano Letters Power 
Steen, Sebcanal Automat.. Teenerneeon TP1 Steer, Wneol rouse 
Gums '  Gonda...mg rid D.Pu•• P,Ituc Bo. Cove. 
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Record Expected for German Fun Run 
Junior High Runs Germanfest - - 

Mothers Honored 
At FHA Banquet 

-Country Roads-  was the 
theme of the 1979 FHA Ban-
quet held on April 10, in the 
cafeteria of Muenster Pub-
lic SchooL Decorations and 
menu were old-fashioned in a 
nostalgic and delightful way. 

FHA members gifted their 
mothers with silk or dry flow-
er arrangements. Candles 
lighted guest tables and an-
tique lanterns lighted the 
head table. 

The menu included fruit 
salad barbecued chicken, 
baked beans, corn-on-the-cob, 
relishes, home-made bread, 
butter and honey and straw-
berry pie. 

Debbie Zinimerer was mis-
tress of ceremonies. Her mo- 
ther, Mrs. Imogene Zimmerer 
gave the Invocation. Maria 
Sicking gave the welcome. 
Louise Walterscheid gave the 
response. Kellie Hale made 
the project report and the 
Homemaking teacher, Mrs. 
Joni Sturm presented Encoun-
ter Awards to Nita Brown-
ing, Judy Dittfurth. Claudia 
Flu.sche Linda Grewing, Cin-
dy Knabe, Melodie Muller, 
Rene Reiter, Rhonda Reiter, 
Denise Sicking, Barbie Wim-
mer and Brenda Wimmer. 

Pro vid ing entertainment 
were Kathie Fisher, Tami 
Fanning, Kim Walterscheid, 
Lou Dyer, Rene Stelzer, Marla 
and Rita Sicking. 

Homemaking II students 
modeled garments they made 
and Donna Fisher concluded 
the program with the Bene-
diction. 

Special guests were the 
FHA sweetheart, Mark Kle-
ment and his mother, Mrs. 
Walter Klement. FHA mem-
bers presented a dried flower 

their contacts at major dist-
ance runs of the year and 
growth experience of the past 
three years. Nevertheless they 
are keenly aware that they 
are depending mostly on the 
right kind of weather. Up to 
now pre-registrations have 
been received from Arkansas. 
Missouri. Loinsana. California 

Ohio besides Oklahoma 
and Texas 

Plans for the race are go-
ing tenet Based on expenence 
.n toe previous fun run. the 
a:rectors have organized a 
staff of some 70 helpers to 
einduct all the details includ-
ing paper work before the 
start and checking the win-
ners in as they finish. Visit-
ing runners have told Hamric 
and Hess that this race is 
one of the best organized of 
them all. and they are mak-
ing every effort to keep im-
proving. 

On the trail they have ar-
ranged again to have workers 
at four aid stations with 
drinks and a refreshing cool 
spra • if it V wanted. In ad-
ditii timers will be at mile 
stat on, teling how many 
me rtes have passed since the 
sts t. 

.gain this tame the chair-
o an have a special request for 
corr'runity cooperation  

bikes and give runners plen-
ty of room at the finish line." 

Paper work preceding the 
race will be done at the Sac-
red Heart football field and 
runners will start at 2 p.m. 
on Main Street heading north. 
The route will be the same as 
last year. following FM 373 
to the second crossroad north 
of town. then go around ap-
proximately a square mile of 
land and return on 373. The 
race will end in the vicinity 
of Muenster Clinic on Maple 
Street A nurses' aid station 
will be located near-by for 
the benefit of exhausted run-
ners. 

The big reason for the pop-
ularity of the Fun Run is its 
good reputation for a fun at-
mosphere and efficient oper-
ation. And interest is sweet-
end by an array of give-
aways, such as T-shirta to 
the first 2000 entrants and 
beer steins to the first 100 
finishers. And there are 
awards galore. The first three 
places of eacn division will re-
nerve a trophy and the next 
three will receive a medal This 
accounts for the nine divis-
ions each of men and women 
plus awards for the youngest 
and oldest finishers of the 
mess and the winners. 

An added feature will be a 
7 - 	Country team race corn- 

Reunions Planned 
At Gerrnanfest by 
'61 and '44 Classes 

Reun. - 	time at the 
Germantest will include two 
class reunions whose initial 
gathering place will be the 
old airplane in the Park. 

On Saturday evening, April 
28, beginning at 8 p.m grad-
uates of 1961 of Muenster 
Public High School and Sac-
red Heart High School and all 
their classmates in the 8th 
grade and through High 
School, are invited to a get-
together for visiting and rem-
iniscing. More information 
may be obtained from Mrs. 
Henry Starke (Margie). 759-
4194 or Mrs. Roger Taylor 
(Janie) 759-4252 

On Sunday afternoon. be-
ginning at 4 p.m_ high school 
graduates of SIMS and MRS 
of 1944 and eighth grade grad-
uates of 1940 and all former 
classmates will reunion at the 
same meeting place. More in-
formation may be obtained 
by phoning Mrs. David Bright 
(Juanita) 759-9482 

Food and drink for both 
events will be available at the 
Germanfest concessions. 

Miss Muenster - - 
for local people in need, and 
the Scholarship Fund to be 
used for two graduating Sen-
iors, one each from Muen-
ster n two schools. The cash 
award must be used to fur-
ther their education. 

The sponsors will welcome 
a full house. The program is 
good and the cause is gond. 
Please come!  

shoes, skateboard contest and 
motorcycle rodeo, besides the 
many programs in the pavil-
ion. 

Actually the Germanfest 
will start before the official 
opening at 4 p.m. Friday. A 
pageant sponsored by Beta 
Kappa Society in Muenster 
High School auditorium 
Thursday night will select 
Miss Muenster, who will be 
queen of the Germanfest. Fif-
teen girls are competing. 

The festival begins with of-
ficial opening of grounds and 
booths at 4 p.m. Friday. On 
the program are accordion 
music by Norma and Sonny, 
a folk dance by Barbie Hess 
and a chug-a-lug contest pre-
ceding the street dance. 

Saturday's schedue starts at 
10, and its principal activities  
are the fun run, a concert by 
NTSU's German band, the 
SH Choral Group's concert, 
Dallas Frohsinn concert, SH 
men's choir concert, Gina 
Hofbauer "'Texas Ideal Miss," 
in a folk dance, a German 
costume contest, a polka 
dance contest and a beard 
contest, plus the dances at 
VFW Hall and the Commun-
ity Center. Meanwhile there 
will be more dancing at the 
pavilion to the tunes of Helga 
Beckman ad Mike Otts' disco. 

The festival will be back in 
business Sunday at 10 and the 
program starts with two 
events at 1 p.m.: the art show 
and a 3 hour concert at the 
pavilion by the Bavarian 
Wood Choppers, a polka band 
from Dallas. Also booked are 
appearances by the MHS 
Hornet Band, the Cooke 
County College Choir, the 
Sacred Heart choir, accordion 
numbers by Sonny and Nor-
ma, Gina's folk dance and a 
3 hour disco dance by Mike 
Otts. Other events of the day 
are skateboard, horse shoes, 
motorcycle road-eo and a 
chug-a-lug contest. Closing 
ceremonies will be held Sun-
day night at 10. 

- Mrs. Bill Tidwell 
Is Cancer Victim 

Funeral service was held 
Monday afternoon at 4 in 
Sanger for Mrs. Bill Tidwell 
who died of cancer at her 
home Saturday, April 21, at 
7 p.m. ending an illness of 
more than 18 months. 

Among pallbearers were 
Jerome Pagel, Clyde Fisher 
and Norbert Bednorz, and a 
number of other Muenster 
friends attended the funeral.  

close every detail, no matter 
how trivial. This situation 
breeds hostility as people be-
come resentful of having 
someone constantly looking 
over their shoulder and inter-
fering with their affairs." The 
congressman, further more, 
ought to have menuoned that 
we are no less resentful about 
those billions of dollars that 
are goofed off in the process. 
Along with the cash value of 
time wasted on unneeded re-
ports there is the cost of pay-
ing unneeded employees to 
process those millions of re-
ports. 

John Connally, in his bid 
for presidential nomination 
seems to have had that kind 
of idea in mind last Sunday 
when he said that federal 
costs can be reduced suffici-
ently to enable a 25 per cent 
reduction in income tax. 

All of which makes sense 
but clashes with an old time 
political fact of life. How will 
reductions be made without 
bringing up a terrible howl 
by those who presently en-
joy a fat income on a soft job? 

Want Ads Bring Results 

Strong at Cowtown 
Junior High boys of Sac-

red Heart scored high in a 
track meet April 14 at Fort 
Worth Country Day SchooL 

Ricky Hennigan won first 
places in the 100 and 220 yard 
dashes and Mike Dangetmayr 
was winner of the one mile 
and two mile runs. 

In addition Wade Walter-
scheid was third and Curtis 
Henscheid fourth in the 330 
yard run and Darrell Swir-
czynski was second in the 880. 
Also the 440 relay and the 
mile relay teams each took 
fourth places. Members of the 
440 team are Ricky Hennigan, 
Darrell Herr, Wade Walter-
scheid and Curtis Henscheid. 
The mile relay runners are 
Ricky Hennigan, Mike Dan-
geknayr, Wade Walterscheid 
arid Darrell Herr. 

Confetti - - - 
cerned with the people's 
rights they would not have to 
worry about the bureaucratic 
snooping and loads of paper 
work which they brought 
down on themselves 

However, in fairness, it 
needs to be said also that the 
nuisance of Naderism has 
caused about as much grief 
as industry's original lack of 
concern. The trouble makers 
demanded perfect and near 
perfect conditions which were 
not necessary in the first 
place besides making enorm-
ous extra demands in expense 
and work load_ 

Another horrible example is 
the IRS, the biggest paper-
work transgressor of them all. 
It gives continuous conflicting 
and inaccurate information, 
often not understood by its 
own personnel, a n d then 
threatens penalties for ignor-
ance of the law. 

In all of these eases, accord. 
ing to Stenholm, the govern-
ment is saying "I do not trust 
the way you run your affairs, 
therefore I am going to regu-
late them and make you dis- 

Tire Specials 
4 ply polyester, Load Range B 

Tubeless Whitewalls 
Size 
	

F ET 
	

Price 

B 78x13 
	

$1.73 
	

523.97 
E 79x14 
	

52.10 
	

$26.16 
F 78x14 
	

52.22 
	

$27.12 
G 78x14 
	

$2.38 
	

528.77 
G 78x15 
	

52.44 
	

528.86 
H 78x15 
	

S2.66 
	

$30.17 
L 78x15 
	

52.96 
	

$33.28 

tr.ese tires 

Knabe Tire & Radiator 
305 N. Minn. 7594141. Muenster 

on the events popularity, with cars, motorcycles and bitted with the regular fun 
run. At the finish the 3 mem-
ber team combines its score 
as its entry for the National 
Road Running Team Cham-
pionship. It will be run in 
high school and open divisions 
and the winners of each will 
receive awards. Registration 
for this event will be on Sat-
urday only. 

Another special feature of 
Fun Run is a runners' clinic 
beginning at 10:30 Saturday 
morning. The purpose is to 
familiarize participants with 
all relevant details: the route, 
various attention along the 
way, availability of first aid 
if wanted and finish line 
procedure in determining the 
order for finish over all and 
in each division 

Atter the contest the run-
ners will be treated to their 
fill of free beer and free soft 
drinks, and awards will be 
presented when the paper 

is finished. about 5:30. 

Nothing improves a per 
son's driving more than a 

arrangement to Mrs. Sturm, police car right in back of 
in appreciation. him. 

! NOTICE ! 
Rohmer's Restaurant 

Now 
Closed Sunday 

Open 
Monday thru Saturday 

Wednesday Night Special 

All You Can Eat 
Fried or Boiled 

Shrimp..s5 95  
With salad bar and baked potato 

or French fries 

STEAKS ... SEAFOOD... 
CHICKEN ... BARBECUE 

Rohmer's Restaurant 
Emil and Agnes Rohmer, Muenster 

Open Monday thru Saturday 

• 
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NOW . . . 50% OFF STICKER PRICE 
ON SPECIAL OPTION PACKAGES 

COME ON IN NOW DURING OUR OPEN HOUSE. 

***  Germanfest 
Wunderbari 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 
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