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34% Rate Increase 
Requested by TP&L 

Looking back over the year 
just ending, we can take com-
fort principally in the Thought 
that our nation is at peace. 
Americans are not dying in 
war. However we have a 
carry - over disappointment 
from the Vietnam war, in 
the enemy's failure to return 
POW's or even give an ac-
count of their fate. Any 
country is entitled to this 
kind of information after the 
hostilities, and the fact that 
the reds have not cooperated 
is proof that many of us are 
correct in regarding them as 
the enemies of all civilization. 

This is a point to keep in 
mind as we see friendly 
gestures by Soviet and 
Chinese Communists. For in-
stance the story from Mos-
cow is that Russians are go-
ing all out to butter up Pres-
ident Elect Carter. They have 
allowed a US produced film 
on Russian TV presenting 
Carter in a favorable light 
and implying Moscow's satis-
faction with him. Another 
sign was an article in Pravda. 
the Communist Party official 
paper, noting the' positive 
character of Carter's recent 
statements on US-Soviet re-
lations, along with the sour 
comment that the "enemies 
of detente have not laid down 
their arms." 

Another consideration be-
hind the show of friendliness 
is Carter's campaign rhetoric 
about cutting down arms 
spending and increasing wel-
fare spending. The masters of 
Moscow would dearly love to 
see U.S. relax its defense ef-
fort while USSR continues its 
extensive arms expansion pro-
gram. Nothing could be more 
pleasing to the Reds than to 
lull this country to sleep 
while they proceed without 
disturbance to the point of 
handing down their ultima-
tum of takeover. 

On the other hand Jimmy 
Carter has done a few things 
since election that appeal to 
us rather than the Reds. He 
has back-tracked on his op-
position to preparedness and 
he has indicated his intention 
to sustain and strengthen 
Nato. Also he has implied that 
his administration's interest 
will center on the entire 
country's welfare and not 
show partiality to the minor-
ity groups supporting him. 

Our hope is that Carter will 
be as good as he claimed to 
be, that ,he will inspire a 
healthy development of the na-
tional economy along with a 
high level of national morale. 
as that our people will be 
both able and willing to pull 
through in case of emergency. 

America needs the kind of 
spirit that prevailed through-
out World War II, when peo-
ple were willing to tighten 
belts and work more hours 
to pull through the crisis. 
This time we're not engaged 
in conflict, but the circum-
stances are vital, nevertheless. 
As during the decline of the 
Roman Empire, our nation is 
being sapped of its vitality 
while its people are pampered 
with bread and  circuses, 
while being corrupted by a 
steady deterioration of moral-
ity. We can see a preview of 
our decline by observing how 
Britain is wasting away in 
its welfare state program. 

With that kind of economic 
outlook, plus constant re-
minders that national secur-
ity is in jeopardy, we have 
to realize that we are head-
ing into serious times. The 
crisis, it not here, is certairly 

(Continued on page 10) 

l^nh imiimsts of clear wea-
ther for the ternainder of this 
year, it appears that the pres-
ent rainfall total of 34$7 
inches will become the local 
measure of the year, accord-
ing to Steve Moster's offitlal 
US Weather Bureau records. 

The total is slightly more 
than an inch below the ten 

Muenster Police 
Report 779 Cases 
During This Year 

A summary of police ac-
tivities in Muenster for the 
year to date reveals a total 
of 779 cases, of which all but 
26 were related to motor 
vehicles. 

Leading the list, as reported 
by Police Chief James Mc-
Donald. are 592 traffic sum-
mons, which include speeding, 
failure to observe stop signs, 
etc. Next was 100 tickets for 
illegal parking, then 10 tic-
kets for driving while intox- 
icated. 

Also three vehicles were 
stolen, one was burglarized 
and 47 were involved in acci-
dents. Of the 47 accidents, 
nineteen were caused by fail-
ing to yield to vehicles on 
the right. 

Other cases were Drunk in 
public, 10; Disorderly conduct, 
15; Theft, 1. 

year average of local rainfall 
ending December 31 last year. 
That average is 36.04. 

The year got off to a dry 
start with a total of only 2.57 
inches following 3.44 inches 
for the last quarter of '75. 
That was 6.01 inches for . 6 
months, and the preceding 
three months had 5.76. The 

Harold Flusches 
Win in Christmas 
Lighting Contest 

SH Teams Lose 2 
Games at Lindsay 

Sacred Heart High basket-
ball teams lost both ends of 
their double header at Lind-
say Monday night Tigerettes 
lost the opener 52-33 after 
which the Tigers were turned 
back 43-42. 

The Tigers started with a 
16-12 first quarter lead and 
continued in front for leads 
of 26-21 and 35-31 in the next 
two peftods Then the Tigers 
made a few mistakes and 
Lindsay cashed in to move 
into an early fourth lead. 
Thereafter the game was a 
see saw with Sacred Heart at 
the short end at the finale. 

Tiger scorers were Joe Hoe-
debeck 16, Glenn Walterscheid 
10, Danny Stock 10, Bob 
Hartman 4, Brent Hess 2. 

In the girls game the Tig-
erettes were following close 
by a count of 26-21 at half 
time and had a miserable 
third quarter in which Lind-
say moved to a comfortable 
lead. Final score was 52-33. 

Marlene Pagel led SH scor-
ing with 16. Liz Kralicke 
added 10 and Sharlene Pagel 
7. Guards were Janet Hen-
scheid, Mary Luke and Don-
na Swircrynski. 

Guests of Mrs. Alfons Koes-
ler Sr. for five days including 
Christmas Day are her daugh-
ters Sister Mary Lin of Flor-
esville and Sister Corrine of 
Laredo. 

As long as there are final 
examinations, there will be 
prayers in public schools. 

in•asure for nine 11101Iti IS end-
ing 'March 31 was 11.77 inches, 
a good reason for the poor 
start made this year by grain 
crops. 

However rainfall improved 
after April 1 resulting in fair 
crops and a near normal total 
for the year. 

The record of the past ten 
years reads as follows. 

County Assured of 
Ambulance Service 

Another year of ambulance 
service in Cooke County was 
assured Tuesday in a meet-
ing of Professional Ambulance 
Service representatives with 
the Cooke County Commis-
sioners Court and the Gaines-
ville City Council. The City 
of Gainesville agreed to un-
derwrite the service for the 
last three months of 1977. 

The ambulance people said 
they were about 300 subscrip-
tions short of the number 
needed to extend their two- 
ambeu.  lance service for another 
year. That amount, less rev- 
enue from future subscrip- 
tions, is guaranteed by Gaines- 

vill  

The Commissioners Court 
will decide later whether to 
join in subsidizing the service. 

Buried Toll Line 
Heads Phone Co. 
Building Program 

Muenster Telephone Corp-
oration has received a loan of 
$389,550 from the telephone 
division of Rural Electrifica-
tion Administration for the 
purpose of financing system 
improvements, including ad-
ditional toll facilities. 

These funds for the Muen-
ster portion of new toll facil-
ities (Mini Muenster to Den-
ton. The Muenster Company 
and Southwestern Bell are 
building a new joint facility 
along highway 82 to Gaines-
ville where it joins the new 
toll cable placed to Denton. 

The Muenster portion in-
cludes a 50 pair specially de-
signed cable buried from the 
Muenster office to the road-
side park on Dry Elm Creek, 
6 miles east of Muenster. This 
cable will be conditioned for 
high frequency radio circuits 
and testing facilities only. By 
digital radio this storm 
proof cable can carry up to 
600 high grade telephone cir-
cuits. 

Initially it will be equipped 
for 168 circuits. 120 will go 
to Denton for message toll --
24 each from Myra, Forest-
burg, and Rosston and 48 
circuits frots Muenster. 48 
circuits will terminate in 
Gainesville for special cir-
cuits between the two towns 
(Muenster and Gainesville). 

A toll testing facility will 
be installed in Muenster to 
administer the Muenster por-
tion of the system and by 
remote control access and 
test toll trunks in Myra, For-
estburg and Rosston along 
with Muenster. ." 

Traffic measuring equip-
ment will be installed in each 
exchange to measure the flaw 
:ltd number of calls from 
the different groups of lines 
to and from the toll trunks 
for engineering and toll 'set-
tlement (division of toll rev-
enue with other telephone 
companies) purposes. This in-
formation will be automatic. 
ally fed to Muenster for eval-
llaijod. 

This project, scheduled for 
completion by March 31. 1977, 
replaces the open wire pole 
line along the ' abandoned 
railroad tracks between 
Muenster end Gainesville. 

Tell service to the Muen-
ster systems should be great-
Iv improved at the comple-
tion. • 

The average man feels 
hetter after a few winks, es-
pecially if she winks back. 

Texas Power & Light Com-
pany has filed with the 
Muenster City Council and 
the Texas Public Utilities 
Commission in Austin, a' re-
quest for a rate adjustment 
that is expected to increase 
company revenues by $135 
million, system-wide. 

The rate increase, an over-
all 34 percent. is based on 
actual operations during the 
test year ended September 
30, 1976. If the use of elec-
tricity experienced in that 
period continued, the percent 
increase would yield some 
$185 million However, as a 
result of higher electric prices, 
the company anticipates in-
creased conservation will re-
duce the actual return to $135 
million 

Bill Bedrick, TP&L mana-
ger. has asked to appear be-
fore the City Council to dis-
cuss the rate increase. 

Councilmen See 
Demonstration of 
Street Sweeper 

The city's next street sweep-
er is likely to be a small drag 
type machine costing one 
fourth to one third as much 
as a big self powered sweep-
er like the city has been us-
ing until lately. 

Members of the city council 
saw it demonstrated Monday 
and liked what they saw. In-
stead of a big truck loaded 
with heavy sweeping equip-
ment, this machine is a light 
weight unit on two wheels 
to be pulled behind a pickup 
or small tractor. Power for 
the mechanism comes through 
gears from the wheels .. as 
simple as the old time push 
mower. 

Besides the lower initial 
cost, about $6800, the machine 
has fewer parts than a self 
powered sweeper, hence is 
expected to need less main-
tenance. 

After seeing the machine 
they will carry impressions to 
the next council meeting and 
reach a decision there. 

Regulations on 
Parking Listed 

By James Molo.hald 
City Policeman 

The Texas Motor Vehicle 
Laws, Article XII, Section 95-
96, clearly permits parking of 
motor vehicles upon any pub-
lic street as long as drivers 
are in compliance with the 
laws. 

You may not park, 
(1) On a sidewalk 
(2) Within any intersection 
(3) On a cross walk 
(4) Upon a bridge 
(5) At any place where OF-

FICIAL SIGNS prohibit stop-
ping. 

(6) In front of a public or 
private driveway 

(7) Within 15 feet of a fire 
hydrant 

(8) Within 20 feet of a 
crosswalk at an intersection 

(9) Within 20 feet of a fire 
entrance 

(10) At any place where OF-
FICIAL SIGNS prohibit stand 
158. 

Every vehicle stopped of 
parked upon a two-way road-
way shall be so stopped or 
parked with the right hand 
wheel parallel to and within 
eighteen (18) inches of the 
right hand curb or edge of 
the roadway. 

Bedrock said the increase is 
expected to meet the com-
pany's financial requirements 
through mid-1979, based on 
current economic trends. 

While the average rates 
charged will be increased 34 
percent, Bedrick says the 
company is continuing its ef-
forts to bring all rates to a 
level that more closely re-
flects the costs of serving 
each class of customers as re-
quired by the Public Utility 
Regulatory Act. Thus some 
rate adjustments will be 
higher than the 34 percent, 
while others will be lower. 

For example, average resi-
dential rates will increase 38.8 
percent, school rates will go 
up 40.2 percent, and municipal 
rates will rise 37.8 percent. On 
the other hand, commercial 
rates, on the average, will in-
crease by only 25.9 percent 
Industrial rates will be ad-
justed 24.9 percent. 

Rapidly rising costs in al-
most all phases of the produc-
tion and distribution of elec-
tricity were cited as reasons 
for the request. 

The company received an 
increase in 1975. However, 
company officials say past in-
creases have not been ade-
quate to halt deterioration of 
the company's financial con-
dition. 

Natural gas, in the near fu-
ture, will not be available in 
sufficient quantities for elec-
tric utilities to use as a fuel 
in generating plants. 

TP&L is in the midst of a 
massive program to build new 
generating plants to be fueled 
by the more available and less 
expensive lignite. A' nuclear 
power plant is also under con-
struction. 

-To accomplish this task," 
Bedrick said, "TP&L must 
raise hundreds of millions of 
dollars each year. Present 
rates simply- will not support 
the tremendous requirements 
for capital in changing from 
the construction of gas gen-
erating facilities to lignite 
and nuclear generating facil-
ities and to meet the future 
electric energy requirements 
of our customers. Neither will 
present rates provide a fair 
return to holders of the com-
pany's common stock. 

"At present, we are one of 
only three utility companies in 
the country with a coveted 
AAA „Pond rating. Our cur-
rent financial position does 
not support that rating. We 
must improve our financial 
position, or lose that rating. 
If our credit is down-graded, 
we will pay higher interest 
rates, and fewer investors 
will be willing to invest their 
money in TP&L These high-
er costs of money must be 
passed on to our customers. 

'Texas Power & Light  is 
making every effort to keep 
the cost, to our customers as 
low as possible and these ef-
fort will continue. But un-
fortunately, the pressure of 
rapidly rising coals has 
brought us to the point that 
we must have this increase 
to meet our customers' energy 

Pick-up of Christmas Trees 
The city's trash truck will 

pick up discarded Christmas 
trees Wednesday of next 
week. Persons wishing to dis-
pose of theirs may arrange a 
pickup by phoning the city 
hall. 759-2236. 

The 199 foot antenna tower 
just completed at Muenster 
Hospital is one unit of a 
communications system which 
soon will enable the hospital 
to keep in touch with its per-
sonnel as well as ambulances 
and other hospitals of North 
Texas. It is scheduled to be 
in operation about the end 
of February. 

Locally it will serve as a 
recall system in which some 
10 key personnel, especially 
doctors and surgical assistants, 
can be reached quickly in an 
emergency. Each of them will 
carry a small receiver set, 
slightly smaller than a pack-
age of cigarettes, which will 
give a beep-beep signal fol-
lowed by a vocal message tell-
ing the nature of the emer-
gency, where the person is 
wanted and other details. 

At this time it is a one 
way system, and the sending 
station cannot be sure the 
message was received, so the 
receiver is expected to phone 
in or report at the hospital 
as soon as possible 

To be added later are small 
transmitters enabling persons 
to tell the sender that the 
message was received and to 
communicate further with the 
station. Range of communica 
tion will be determined by 
testing. After that persons will 
be expected to remain within 
range while they are on call. 
Messages can be sent indi-
vidually or they can be 
beamed together so that sev-
eral receivers or all will get 
them at the same time. 

Next stage of the station's 
use is communicating with 
ambulances and other hos-
pitals of the area Range will 
be considerably farther then 
because the receiving equip-
ment of stations will be more 
sensitive than the small por-
table receivers assigned to in-
dividuals. Hospitals expected 
to be eventually included in 
the network are those of 
Gainesville, Denison, Sherman 
Denton, Decatur, Bridgeport,

, 

 Bowie and Nocona. AU of 
them are within range of the 
local station and can com-
municate directly with it. 

And by use of a relay sys-
tem it will be possible to com-
municate with hospitals that 
are out of range, even those 
that are several times farther 
away than the range limit. It 

Antenna for Recall 
Installed at Hospital 

Rainfall Total for 1976 Is 34.97 Inches 

consists of receiving the mes- Mr. and Mrs. Harold Flu-
sage and transmitting it to the sche are this year's winners 
next station. This could be a in the Christmas lighting con-
matter of just repeating the test sponsored by the Muen-
message or of recording it ster Knights of Columbus 
somehow for direct transmis- with emphasis on putting 
non to the next dation. Christ back in Christmas. 

Although such communica- Their prize was $25. 
lion is desirable, the system's 	Second place honor,' and a 
principal purpose is to main- $15 award, went to W. J. 
lain contact with local per- Miller; and third place, with 
sonnet and still allow them a $10 award went to Herbert 
freedbrn of movement while Miller. 
they are subject to call. Know- Judges were Patty Eberhart, 
ing that they can be alerted Gerry Sangster and Ethel 
anywhere within the system's Metzler. With Joe Hoenig as 
range, they do not have to driver and guide, they made 
restrict their activity to areas an inspection tour of the city 
where they can be reached by Wednesday night of last 
phone. week. Peter McCoy was con-

Besides it can save precious test chairman for the KCs. 
time when the message is re-
ceived by all or several at once 
whereas telephone calls would 
be separately to each and in-
volve probably delays while 
the person is called to the 
phone. 

The recall system has been 
the Number 1 project of the 
Hospital Auxiliary for /sev-
eral years. As the time ap-
proached for installing it, plans 
started shaping for the ex-
panded system. So the big-
ger system is being installed 
and cost is shared by the aux-
iliary and the hopital district 
- the auxiliary's share being 
equivalent to the cost of the 
smaller, shorter range system. 

Ten Year Moisture Record 
Yr. 	Jan. Feb Mar. Apr. May June July Aug. Sept. Oct. Nov. Dec. 	Total 
'88 	2.50 	4.55 	1.83 	8.43 	2.30 	3.57 	1.54 	6.94 	4.58 	.67 	.63 	1.47 	37.51 
'87 	.15 	.87 	1.46 	3.82 	7.92 	1.52 	2.02 	1.16 	4.25 	2.00 	.96 	1.70 	27.82 
'68 	4.67 	1.71 	5.36 	4.88 	5.93 	5.20 	5.21 	.81 	2.76 	3.31 	2.63 	1.29 	43.56 
'69 	2.41 	2.71 	5.35 	3.38 	6.54 	2.42 	.75 	2.00 	5.79 	5.10 	.60 	3.87 	40.92 
'70 	.36 	3.43 	2.57 	4.83 	4.05 	1.09 	1.09 	.19 11.61 	1.56 	.52 	.57 	3221 
'71 	.41 	.97 	.36 	1.45 	3.25 	.99 	1.86 11.57 	4.58 	6.69 	2.10 	4.92 	40.22 
'72 	.37 	.45 	.36 	4.10 	3.03 	.84 	1.12 	1.88 	4.01 	5.04 	3.46 	.69 	23,19 
'73 	3.38 	2.26 	3.46 	4.57 	5.27 	5.07 	8.91 	.16 	4.70 	4.69 	3.06 	.63 	46.18 
'74 	.36 	1.68 	1.14 	4.98 	.23 	1.58 	.92 	4.65 	8.94 	9.28 	1.98 	1.90 	37.00 
'75 	1.86 	3 42 	4.94 	223 	588 	3.18 	2.02 	1.94 	1.80 	.82 	.91 	1.71 	30.72 
'76 	.08 	.52 	1.97 	6.47 	706 	3.45 	3.35 	.88 	4.50 	4 49 	.54 	1.59 	34.97 
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Red Rose Dried, 12 oz. 

BLACKEYE PEAS...25c 
Shurfi ne 

Brown & Serve 	 3 -$1.00 
Shurfine 

Bread, P/2 lb. loaf 	 3-$1.00 
Shurfine 17 oz. 

Fruit Cocktail 	  3 - $1.00 

Velveeta Cheese 	  $1.99 
Ranch Style Beans, 15 oz. 4 - $1.00 
Shurfine Jumbo Roll 

Kounty Kist 

Paper Towels 	  
Gladiola Flour, 5 lb 	 
Cake Mixes, Shurfine 	 

49c 

39c 
59c 
49c 

CORN, 15 oz 	  4 -$1.00 

Shurfine P oz. twin pock 

Potato Chips 	  

Cream Cheese, 8 oz. 	 59c 
Spanada Wine, 5th 	 $1.19 

HOFBAUER'S Coupon Carnival 

for a 
Very Good '76 
RS2-K2,96•990,-/.."--C/sw2wPit.9•29,49,-,...1,69,...9909oPMFT9S9" 

MEATS 
Decker Korn Kist 

BACON .. e lb. 49c 

Rath Sausage lb. 79c 

Picnics   lb. 59c 

Decker Franks ,,oz 59c 

Chuck Roast lb. 59c 

Ground Chuck lb. 99c 

Stew Meat . . lb. 99c 

Club Steak . lb. $1.09 

Start the' New Year by 
adding extra savings to 
your weekly food budget. 
You can depend on us for 
low food prices every Day. 

1 
0 
0 

VALUABLE COUPON fa vEl' 4.1e9 trda 

Save 40B Per Lb. 
SILVER SPUR KINDLESS SLAB 

Sliced Bacon L. 58c 
LIMIT ONE PKG. PER FAMILY WITH THIS COUPON 

HOFBAUER'S AFFILIATED STORE 

EFFECTIVE NOW THPU JAN 5. 1977 

C^i rawas 1/4`r) ra ra 1/41.1  rel. 1/47.1  eal 4;,. ‘T,   

191.1.•ezh1/41% arz ■...! VALUABL ;COUP° 

Save 900  Per Bag 

Shurfine Sugar 5 LB. BAG 

Limit one 5 lb. bag per family with 
• 	purchase of six light bulbs. 

HOFBAUER'S AFFILIATED STORE 
EFFECTIVE NOW THRU JAN 5, 1977 	

ff 
,pvn  ‘711 	'IV rah 	11.  erib-i 

5 
0 

41 

VALUABLE COUPON n'ia ve% elaa 

Save $1 20  On 6 Pkgs. 

11-13 01 390 

Dinners...... 
LIMIT 6 PER FAMILY WITH THIS COUPON 

HOFBAUER'S AFFILIATED STORE 
THRU JAN 5 1977 

41 

4 

BANOUET• FROZEN crocus 

EFFECTIVE NO 

triA V29  CA 119  ea) 	"19  sa (a) `rd ea vs Az 0 

cI 

01 
of ilea ONE PKG. PEA FAMILY WITH THIS COUPON 

HOFBA'IFFIS AFFILIATED STORE 
EFFECTIVE NOW THRU JAN 5 1977 

"W" anel.  trin 1-1  VALUABL4 COUPON ea% vaY nil VS41.1 

Save  5 1 07  Per Pkg. B) 
4.1 

-0 
Aver., `vas Greo tah tial Li (ANL" eieltv/ZA  

DECONGESTANT. COLD CAPSULES 

Contac.... 10 CT. PKG. 88° 

143-14, Vyri.Nv-•  

Save 78' On 2 Cups 

1 0° 
-0 
(11 	 B)  

EFFECTIVE NOW THRU JAN 5, 1977 - 

Cifa 	e9 vw ea IN a tai tr., fa 

BROCKWAY 

VALUABLE COUPON 6:11'W6iia%Ve2A,... 

B) 
El Coffee Mugs... EACH 

LIMIT a CUPS PER FAMILY WITH THIS COUPON 

HOFBAUER'S AFFILIATED STORE 

Produce 
Potatoes .. 20 lb. $l" 

Tomatoes 	 lb. 29c 

Lettuce 	 hd. 29c 

Grapefruit 5 lb. 39c 

Bananas   lb. 15c 

Yellow Onions I 7c 

Lemons ea. 10c 
Ocean Spray, Fresh 

Cranberries lb. 39c 

Save $1 60  On Two 5 Lb. Bags 
RUBY RED 

Grapefruit .. 5 LB BAG 39°  

LIMIT TWO 5 LB BAGS PER FAMILY WITH THIS COUPON 

HOFBAUER'S AFFILIATED STORE 
EFFECTIVE NOW THRU JAN 

vzior.A /TA ra /iA 	 friA 

1 

4 Fryers .. lb. 33c Pot Pies -$1.00 

2 - 29c 

59c 

5 - $ I. Cold Capsules 88c 

-:- Courtesy -:- Price 

1101:BAUER'S 
AFFILIATED 

-.)VA\I; 	)))v J 	(,••• 

41 vAvi 	1 0''' 
AND 

FROZEN 

Old South 9 in. pkg. of 1 

Pie Shells 	 
Pet Ritz all flavors 

Pies 	 
Shurfine h or 

Orange Juice 

Service 

MILK 
gal. $1.39 
COKE 

8 pack 59c 

DRUGS 
Reg. $1.49 Right Guard Stick 

Deodorant 	 99c 
Reg. 69c Hollywood 

Candy 6 pack 49c 

Rubbing Alcohol I Oc 
Shurfine 200 count 

Facial Tissue 	 43c 
With Coupon, Contac 10 

SHORTENING 
3 lb.  

Shurfine . . . 99c 

Crisco . . . $1,49 

COMPARE! 
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Special Liturgy 
for Midnight Mass 

Solemnity and beauty fea-
tured the liturgy for Mid-
night Mass on Christmas Eve 
in Sacred Heart Church. The 
impressive religious ceremon-
ies preceding Mass included 
a torchlight procession, carols 
and instrumental selections 
and traditional blessing of 
the crib scene. 

Parishioners, and their rela-
tives here to spend Christmas 
with family or kin, began to 
arrive near 11 p.m. to hear 
the carols and instrumental 
music. Long before midnight 
the church was filled. 

The instrumental group 
from the .Muenster Public 
School directed by Mrs, David 
Bright, was followed by the 
choral group from Sacred 
Heart High. 

Frank Luke, who also led 

the choral group, directed 
the Sacred Heart Choir sing-
ing Joseph Ruff's "Mass for 
Two Voices." Anthony Luke 
was the organist. 

Father Placidus Eckart and 
Father Stephen Eckart were 
con-celebrants of the Midnight 
Mass. 

Participating in the tradi-
tional blessing of the crib 
scene were the con-celebrants, 
altar boys, and three seniors, 
Sandy Voth, who carried the 
statue of the Infant Jesus in 
the entrance procession, Kathy 
Bartush and Sally Endres, 
who carried nosegays of holly 
to place at the foot of the 
altar where the crib scene 
rested. 

In a break with tradition of 
long standing, the natural 
cedar trees reaching the ceil-
ing, were replaced this year 
with two large artificial trees 
at each side of the High Al- 

tar. 
Th e entrance procession 

was led by eight seniors, car-
rying lighted torches,, whose 
significance was "The Light 
of the World". Participants 
were Sharlene Pagel, Tina 
Mollenkopf, Judy Fisher, Tina 
Wilde, George Luke, Calvin 
Otto, Chuckie Koester, and 
Albert Zimmerer. Sam Bright 
was narrator. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Insel of 
Gainesville and Mr. and Mrs. 
Stan Wylie and Johnny of 
Grand Prairie were guests of 
their mother and grandmo-
ther, Mrs. Bill Kathman Sun-
day for an early observance 
of Christmas with dinner and 
a gift exchange. Other grand-
children were unable to at-
tend because of work sched-
ules. 

Try 'em! You'll like 'ern! 
Enterprise Classifieds 

137 Attend MAP 
Christmas Party 

A festive holiday party for 
MAP was attended by 137 
persons Tuesday, December 21, 
at the Community Center. 

The lovely event was opened 
at 2 p.m. with a program of 
German carols by Sacred 
Heart students of Anna Her-
mes. Surprise highlight of 
their program came when the 
little children scattered among 
the crowd with song sheets, 
seeking their grandparents, 
aunts, uncles or neighbors, to 
coax them to join in the car-
oling. 

Table games followed until 
4 p.m. when there was a gift 
exchange and a sing-along 
led by Father Placidus and 
Leo Henscheid in German 
and English. 

A bountiful Christmas din-
ner was served at 5 p.m. and 
included traditional turkey  

and  dressing Lunchroom 
personnel prepared and served 
the dinner. 

Tables were decorated with 
red and green streamers on 
white cloths. Four arrange-
ments of holly and berries, 
topped with snow birds, were 
used as centerpieces on long 
tables. Each arrangement in-
cluded jade candles in crys-
tal holders encircled with 
hand made lace-like collars, 
with accents of pine cones and 
poinsettias. 

The party room was bright 
with additional holiday dec-
orations and the Christmas 
tree. 

Guests registered from 
Muenster, Myra, Lindsay and 
Gainesville. Janis Grey of the 
Regional Planning fCcenmis-
sion visited a short time 
Other guests from out of 
town included Sister Roberta 
Hesse and Sister Barbara Be, 
nauer who are , spending 

Christmas vacations with re- 	"Myriad" literally means 
latives here. 	 ten thousand. 

           

Sign on a Nevada highway: 
Two-to-one, you're heading 
for Las Vegas. 

Even a new broom won't 
sweep clean unless someone 
uses it. 

     

   

THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 

 

 

Published every Friday, except the fourth week in IWY• 
Alvin G. Hartman. Publisher 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
la Cooke Courtly   1 year 54.00, 2 year, PAO 
Outside Cooke County  	 I year SAM 2 year@ 111.50 

Sccond-clam postage paid at Muenster, Texas 

   

Any erroneous reflection upon the c 	

a 

haracter, standing or reputa- 
on of any person. firm or corporation that may appear La the 

Enterprise will be corrected upon being brought to the ttention 
of the Publisher. 

 

           

    

TEXAS PRESS 
MEMBER 1976 ASSOCIATION 

  

           

           

           

A 



MENU 	Remove heavy wrapping 

Muenster Public School 
January 3-7 

Monday — Fish Squares, 
buttered rice, green beans, 
beet pickles, chocolate cake, 
bread, butter and milk. 

Tuesday — Irish Stew,  
blackeye peas, corn bread, 
syrup, butter, bread and milk 

Wednesday — Meat loaf, 
cream potatoes, kraut, pine-
apple pudding, butter, bread 
and milk. 

Thursday — Chicken and 
noodles, peas and carrots, pea-
nut butter, crackers, peaches, 
milk, 'bread and butter. 

Friday — Hamburgers and 
all the trimmings, pork and 
beans, brownies and milk . 

SHIRLEY'S 

Kut & Karl 
Beauty Shop 

Shirley Eldred. Owner 
S. of H & W Meat Co. 

759-4524 

Public Notice 
Texas Power & Light Company, in accordance 

with provisions of the Public Utility Regulatory 
Act of Texas. hereby gives notice of the Com-
pany's intent to implement new schedules of 
electric service rates in areas served by the Com-
pany, effective January 26, 1977, or as soon there-

after as permitted by law. 

The rate schedules will result in a 34 percent 
increase in the average rates charged. However, 
due to greater customer conservation, the rate 
changes are expected to Increase the adjusted 
gross revenue of Texas Power & Light Company 
by 27 percent. 

A complete copy of the new rate schedules is 
on file with the Public Utility Commission at 
Austin, Texas. and with each affected municipal-
ity, and is available for inspection in each of the 
Company's public business offices. 

TEXAS POWER & LIGHT COMPANY 
A Uut-payina, investor-owned aactic 

r.1%"-r7O-la-Sa 	 C"-Ir•ZSa aea•Vra 

Inventory 	4 

Clearance 

s LE 
Now in progress at 4 

p 	  
9 BEN FRANKLIN' 

Anthony and Leona Luke 

as-CP_C?a 

paper before placing fresh 
fonds in your refrigerator or 
freezer. However, be sure to 
keep all items sealed properly. 
Why spend energy chilling 
heavy paper? 

1111 1111 11111111 1111 11I 

In All 
The World 
No one Is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you. 

G -c:31,k1r1,13 

1111111 C,1111; 

Inlook Outlet of Gainesville 
Formerly Weathouse Outlet 

SPECIAL HOLIDAY SALE 
Fall Ready-to-Wear 

1/2 off 
Large selection, long and short 

PARTY DRESSES 
Juniors 3-13, Misses 6-16, Half Sizes 14 1/2-24 1/2 

See Our New Spring Fabrics 

!master  charge 
The Inlook Outlet 

Store Hours: 9 to 5, Mon. thru Sat. 
114 N. Commerce, 668-8351. Gainesville 

Hospitalization 
Group Insurance 

Life 
Pension • 

Wallace Inghsh 
1018 N. Grand 

Gainesville, Texas 
668-8566 

Fine wines & liquors 

make ideal gifts 

to give or 

receive 

Lose Weight 
Safely 

with Dex•A-Diet Tablets 
Only 98c at 

WATTS BROTHERS 
Gainesville 

Anybody who imagines a 
bulge is a curve can believe 
anything. 

The only mammal purple 
in color is the blesbok, a 
small South African antelope. 

Try 'emi You'll like 'ern! 
Enterprise Want Ada 

Your dinners will be extra special 
when served with wine 

Stock up for holiday 
treating or giving 

Grady Jones Cut Rafe Liquor 
Muenster, Lindsay 

IT HAPPENED 
40 YEARS AGO 

Dec. 25, 1936 

Shorty Herr leases Flusche 
Bros. garage and assumes Ford 
agency. Lawrence, Al and Con-
rad Flusche will move to De-
catur this weekend. Mission 
services close here with record 
crowd in attendance. FMA dis-
tributes about $3,500 in checks 
to about 150 local preferred 
claim holders on Christmas. 
Andy Schoech, Mrs. Al Wies-
man and the I. A. Schoecbs 

It's Time To REGISTER! 

For SPRING 1977 Classes at 

COOKE COUNTY COLLEGE 
Fully Accredited Academic & Vocational Curriculum 

Registration January 5-6 
(Late Registration January 10-12) 

Time permits and trial schedule sheets may be ob -
tained at Registrar's Office on campus from 8 a.m. to 
4:30 p.m. Monday through Friday. Counselors on duty 
to help you work out course schedules and degree 
plans in Room 108 during regular school hours and 
from 5:30 to 8 p.m. Monday and Thursday. 

Classes Begin January 10 

COME TO COOKE COUNTY COLLEGE AND 
"LEARN A LIVING"! 

FOR MORE INFORMATION CALL OR WRITE: 
Joe Fox, Director, Office of Admissions & Registrar 
(817) 668-7731 Ext. 42 
P. 0. Box 815, Gainesville, Texas 76240 

Year-End Clearance 
and 

Pre-Inventory Sale 
Now in Progress 

Store-wide Bargains 
in Every Department 

K's will close at 5 New Year's Eve 

and will be closed all of New Year's Dav 

  

Store Hours 
Open 9:30 to 6 
Closed Sunday 

North Interstate 35, Gainesville 
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are spending the holidays in 
Springfield, Mo. A shipment 
of 3500 pounds of Muenster 
butter was delivered to Swift 
and Company in Ardmore dur-
ing the week. Twenty-three 
children receive First Com-
munion during midnight Mass 
at Lindsay. 

35 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 26, 1941 

Ensign Robert Weinzapfel, 
24. naval dive bomber pilot 
assigned to USS Lexington, is 
Muenster's and Cooke Coun-
ty's first casualty in World 
War II; details are not yet 
available, requiem Mass and 
military honors are conducted 
here. Community tops $300 
quota in Red Cross drive. Fa-
ther Bernard Zell observes 
golden jubilee as priest. Road 
project to Hays near com-
pletion. Mr. and Mrs. Eddie 
Hart of Dallas receive minor 
injuries in car accident north-
west of the city as they arrive 
here to spend the 'holidays. 
Muenster State Bank declares 
five percent dividend. 

30 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 27, 1946 

Dick Cain replaces Frank 
Solomon in Livestock Auction 
partnership with E. A. Fel-
ker. Both schools present 
Christmas pageants. Sodality 
girls install new officers; Mary 
Nell Hennigan is prefect. The 
Val Fuhrmans move into 
their new home. Sacred Heart 
PTA sponsors Yule party with 
89 students and 50 parents as 
guests. Sgt. and Mrs. Mike 
Tarantola and son Micky of 
Fort Lewis, Wash., are spend-
ing the holidays here with the 
Myricks and at Weatherford 
with her mother. School chil-
dren have a full two weeks' 
holiday. 

25 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 28, 1951 

'Mrs. Frances Ha verkamp, 
former resident, dies in Fort 
Worth on Christmas day. New 
city water well is half drilled 
and awaits casing. Local sale 
figures show livestock is big 
business here. Sacred Heart 
Mosaics wins national honors 
awarded by Catholic Press 
Association. Keith Tompkins 
loft the states this week for 
Japan. Juanita Weinzapfel, 
teaching school in Germany, 
visits the Holy Land on Christ-
mas vacation. Relatives and 
friends flock home for the 
holidays. 

20 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 28, 1956 

Milk plant volume scours as 
holiday surplus pours in. 
Bank stockholders receive div- 
idends. Sixteen fast teams are 
matched for MRS tournament. 
Scholastic census begins Jan- 
uary 2. Expansion project at 
Muenster Mill nears comple- 
tion. Moisture measure for 
1956 totals 1952. Mr. and Mrs. 
I. A. Schoech celebrate golden 

wedding anniversary Baptist 
Church has Christmas pro-
gram. Miss Margaret Gruber, 
working in Franlcfart, Ger-
many under Civil Service, 
spent the holidays in Switzer-
land. Mrs. J. S. Russell is re-
covering from major surgery. 

15 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 29, 1961 

Parish will have celebration 
Jan. 1 for recently elected 
Abbot Alfred Hoenig. William 
Seyler, 70, of Valley View dies 
suddenly of heart attack on 
Christmas Day. Walterscheid 
and Mollenkopf open oil field 
supply. Local rainfall for 1961 
is 30.91 inches. The Joe Felder-
hoffs are in Joliet, Ill., to spend 
the holidays with her moth-
er. Muenster has a new family 
— Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Med-
deco and children who have 
moved 'here from Memphis, 
Term_ Full house cheers Christ-
mas program by Lindsay stu-
dents. Nora Trubenbach joins 
Muenster Telephone Company 
as new operator. Family- re-
unions and Christmas parties 
are social highlights. 

10 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 30, 1966 

Total moisture measure for 
1966 is 37.51 inches, topping 
previous ten year average. 
Joe Fette, 60, dies suddenly 
of heart attack. Open house 
fetes Ike Fultons on 50th an-
niversary. The public is urged 
to attend meeting on school 
costs. Mrs. Lee Morris, 84, dies 
in Amarillo. Miss Diana Horn 
and Airman Jay Winslow 
marry. Miss Pat Hartman and 
John Yosten also say wedding 
vows. Family reunions are 
highlights of Christmas time. 
And long distance telephone 
calls brings families together 
over the line if not in person. 
Anton Dieter, 58, of Lindsay 
dies. Dianne Gehrig and Al-
fred Hacker are hospitalized 
after Christmas Eve collision; 
Pauline Fleitrnan is treated 
and dismissed. 

5 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 31, 1971 

Alan Miller is named on 
Fort Worth Star Telegram's 
All-State Football team. 
Singing Cadets of A and 
M will appear in concert in 
Gainesville. City Building Per-
mits for 1971 are $318,000. Fire 
men answered 47 calls in '71. 
Final rites 'held for Glenn 
Hacker, 22 of Valley View, a 
recent returnee from Vietnam 
who was killed in motorcycle 
accident Dolores Pels and 
Danny Eberhart say vows at 
Mass. Names of 45 men who 
have served on City Council 
in city's 45 years are published 
in December 31, 1972 issue of 
Enterprise. Many holiday par-
ties and family reunions occur 
in Muenster homes. Patients 
and staff of Hillcrest Manor 
cheered by various organiza-
tions and church groups who 
visited, brought gifts and good-
ies and, sang. 

Honey bees carry water as 
well as honey. Special carriers 
bring it to the hive, dole it 
out seal it in cells, or even 
act as storage tanks them-
selves until the water is 
needed. 

The be-aTer, v--7-.1 —ten fright-
ened or disturbed, strikes the 
surface of the water a re-
sounding slap with its broad, 
flat tail. Every beaver within 
hearing distance disappears as 
if by magic. 

I: 



Call 
Dan Luke 

759-2522 
FOR 

BUTANE 
PROPANE 
FINA GAS 
FINA OIL 

FINE DIAMONDS 
WATCHES, JEWELRY 

WATCH REPAIR 

ROESLER JEWELRY 
Muenster 

Sewing Machines 
Run like new 

Repaired at the 
SINGER CO. 

835 E. California 

665-9812. Gcdnesville 

Roofing 
and men 
to install 

Happy It  

New Year 
To Our Customers 

and a reminder 

that we will close 

at Noon Friday 

PHONE 
759-2550 

I sears 1 

ii ti 

S 

0 

315 E. California 	0 
Gainesville 

CB Radios 
S B E 

Robyn 
Browning 

Pearce Simpson 
Xtal 

Johnson 

HUDGINS 
203 E. Calif. 
Gainesville 

665-2542 

is  
ti  

SAVE FUEL COSTS 
With aluminum storm units and insulation. 

Inquire at 

NATIONAL BUILDING CENTERS 

Muenster, 759-2232 

FOR RENT WANTED 

ELECTRICAL 
INSTALLATIONS 

& REPAIRS 
AIR CONDITIONING 

REFRIGERATION 
HEATING 

Residential & Commercial 

GRIGGS ELECTRIC 
Mobile Phone 759.41110 

768-2759, after 5 

Electrical 

Trouble Shooting 

Residential and com-
mercial. Also re-wiring 
or new installations. 
Milton Knout, 759-4160, 
Muenster. 	 38-U 

SEWING MACHINES 

VACUUM CLEANERS 
STEREOS. TAPES 

Records & Accessories 

SALES A SERVICE 
ALL MAKES 

Hudgins 
203 E. Calif., Gainesville 

665-2542, 665-5974 

Automatic trans. serv. 
and overhaul, spin wheel 
balance, air cond. serv., 
auto-truck-tractor serv. 
and overhaul, brake and 
electric sera. 

Bob's Auto Service 
759-4.474 

You Bend 'Em 
WE'LL 

MEND 'EM 
Car rebuilding 

& painting 
Windshields. Door glare 

FREE ESTIMATES 

AL HORN 
5th & Cedar, 759-4471 

30t1 

Dozer Service 
Call or See 

Frank Hess 
759 4749 

I L 
„ NO TIME LIMIT 

FREE REPLACEMENT 
GUARANTEEI 

Community 
Lumber Co. 

Muenster 
• • 

the peopk dna 

= We're RADIAL TIRE Headquarters 
• ritaaraariP AUGNISIENT • Mint. IaLAMGIN• • 

• Ada COND. 518rC1 • SHOCK MISOltlielti • KAU IRWIN• 

"OFFICIAL INSPECTION STATION" 

102 N. Chestnut. Gc.,,nesville, 665-2731 

iatail...--lataialaa:  • 

Fabrics 
Big selection plus 

patterns, thread, notions 

Flooring 
Carpet and Vinyl 
Expert installation 

Let us serve you. 
we'll appreciate it. 

Modern Floors 
and Fabrics 

Onen a to 5.35 
Monday thru Saturday 
Rev Sr Jane Monday 

759-2a it. lafueiater 
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CLASSIFIED AD RATES 
Mat bwertion 6 cent. per word. 

Minimum 51.00 
Following insertion a cord. per 
word. 	Minimum 50 cent. 

DISPLAY CLASSIFIED 
Finn Insertion 	per cot In. 51.50 
S tanding Ad 	per coL 	51.00 

DISPLAY IN BORDER 
roe Insertion 	per col. in. 51.75 
S tanding ad 	per col In. 51.25 

CARDS OF THANKS 
Sr per word. minimum. 51.25 

LEGAL NOT ICE RATES 
Aral Lase.Ion 2 ents per word. 
Following Insertion 1 cent per word. 

Miscellaneous 
Custom Kitchen Cabinets 

Formica Tops 
Free Estimates 

Uncle Ed's Cabinet Shop 
603 N. Grand, 665-1621 

Gainesville 	12tf 

FREE ESTIMATES on 
porch railing, burglar guards, 
spiral stairs. mailbox stands. 
etc. Dale Lloyd's Welding 
Service, East Highway 82, 
Gainesville. 665-0786. 51-tf 

FOR SALE 
Used rock maple dining 

table. Used record player. 
Hess Furniture, 759-4455. 5-2 

For Mary Kay cosmetics, 
free facials and re-orders, call 
Donna Johnston. 759-4531. 3-tf 

See Jan Cain for 
MARY KAY 

products 
Free Facials 

Call 759-2746 

For Home Delivery of 
Fort Worth Star Telegram 
or Dallas Morning News 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

458-7828, Bx 548. Sanger 16t/ 

SAVE 
On utility bills by adding 

blown in INSULATION . 

See or call Tony Klement 
or National Building Centers 

	

759-2232 	27-11 

GLASS: Plate, window, auto-
mobile, furniture tops, mirrors. 
Complete glass service. We 
handle insurance claims. 
Gainesville Glass Shop. 665-
3321, 311 N. Chestnut 37t2 

Try 'em! You'll like 'ern! 

Enterprise Classified' 

MOTORS, a 1 l sizes, for 
making machines, water 
pumps. Aermotor equipment, 
etc. 

NATIONAL BUILDING 

	

CENTERS 	49.tt 

LET US ADD Central Heat 
and Air Conditioning to your 
home National Building Cen-
ters 759-2232. Muenster. 4941 

INSULATE for comfort and 
economy. Community Lum-
ber Co. Muenster. 52-tf 

CERAMIC TILE New and 
old ins*.aila -.1on For estimate 
call Ted Hensebeid, 759-4280, 
Muenster. 3t1 

Water Pumps 
Submersible 
H.P. to 40 H.P. 

Plastic Pipe 
A very Inexpensive 
way to get water 

where you need it . 

NATIONAL BUILDING 
CENTERS 
Muenster 

M2?1,Ele-e•te"-.2.•Ceererce."e',...,","?",  

TANKS. Septic tanks, stock 
tanks, grain tanks, water tanks . 
Will install. Bayer concrete 
Phone 759-4244. Muenster. 

Farmers & Ranchers 

We have 
T Fence Posts 
Barbed Wire 
Electric Fence 

Equipment 
NATIONAL 

BUILDING CENTERS 

Muenster 

APPLIANCES 

Zenith TVs, Maytag 
Washers and Dryers 

and other top brands 

We service all brands 

MUENSTER BUTANE 
759-4411 

PROTECT YOU and your 
house while you sleep. Smoke 
alarms available at Commun-
ity Lumber Company. 37-tf 

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies 

Structural Steel 
and Pipe 

Metal Sales, Inc. 
On Highway 82 

west o/ Gelneswifa 

Buy, sell, rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads. 

NEED FLOOR 
COVERING? 

Carpet 

Linoleum 

Tile 

Dnapes 

GAINESVILLE 
CARPETS 

212 E. California 
Richard Neu 

Dorothy Barnes 

PLUMBING 
Installation & Repair 

Residential & Commercial 

FIXTURES, SUPPLIES. 

McDonald Water Pumps 

Robert Russell Plumbing 
759-4155 or 759-4580 

Muenster 	31-tf 

WRANGLERS 
Shoes - Boots 

Work - Dress • Western 

Nocona Boots 

Men'■ & Boys' Store 

J. R. Hocker 
207 N. Commerce, Gainesville 

New Kirby 

203 E. Calif.. 665-2542 
Gainesville 

CLEANERS 

Hudgins 

VACUUM 

Let Us Prove 
To You 

That we have the 

Best Buys 
In North Texas 

Otts' 
Furniture 

& Appliance 
South Side 

Court House Square 
Gainesville, Texas 

Reduce safe and fast with 
Go Bese Tablets and E-Vap 
"water pills." Muenster Phar-
macy. 2-8p 

FOR SALE: Maytag washer. 
Mrs. Joe Voth. 	 1-tf 

Jimmy Mosman 
665-4698 or 668-8066 

• 1111■11111•11■1 

Buy, sell rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads. 

FOR RENT: one-bedroom 
house. Phone 759-4146 after 5. 

3-tf 

MOBILE HOME for rent. 2 
bedroom, fully furnished, a 
block from school on N. Wal-
nut Ph. 759-2268, Jerome Pa-
gel. 16-tf 

SERVICE 
Will Till Your Garden 

Call after 4 p m 739-4303, 
Charlie Pagel 

GENERAL HAULING -
Wood. lumber, hay, grain or 
miscellaneous. Phone 768-2792. 
James Penton, Jr., Rosston, 
Texas. 6-4p 

CONCRETE WORK: Any kind 
of a concrete job, or furnish 
ready mix concrete. Bayer 
Concrete. 28t1 

CUSTOM DRAPERIES 

Free Decorating 
Professional Installation 

HESS FURNITURE CO. 
41-ti 

BE YOUR OWN BOSS. 
Contact Muenster area pro-
tected accounts. No exper-
ience necessary. We train. 
Write B. K. Crawford, Pres., 
PANCO. Box 52, Fort Worth, 
Tex. 76101 6-1 

COOK 
WANTED 

$3.00 per hour for indi- 
vidual qualified to run 
a shift. Apply in person 
at the Nite-Out, Lindsay. 

6-1 

WANTED: Someone to fix 
noon meal for elderly lady 
5 or 6 days a week. Also part-
time light housework. 759-
2747. 5-2 

BIDS WANTED 
The city of Muenster will 

accept sealed bids until 7:30 
p.m.. on Monday, Jan. 3, 1977, 
on one 1976 tractor with rear 
mounted mower with 7 foot 
cutting width. A copy of speci- 
fications is available at the 
city hall. 	 9-1 

eignie0•A‘Gind:eideet2e.4e.p ...6...".  

WANTED 
Hairdresser needed, 

full or part-time. Call 
Carol's Beauty Salon, 
759-2573. 49-ti 

0•47.0.0•0•4,0•4•0.2,9-• 

WANTED: 
Rod Machine Operator 
Must be experienced 

Also helpers 
No experience necessary 

Grevring Brothers 26-0 

WANTED: LVN and aides 
'5 Hillcrest Manor, West Hwy 
d2, Muenster. Apply in person 

Try 'ern! You'll like 'em! 
Enterprise Classifieds 

Reunion Held by 
G. Lutkenhaus Kin 

Children of the late Mr. and 
Mrs. George Lutkenhaus hos-
ted a retinion of relatives in 
Lindsay Parish Hall Sunday, 
December 26 at noon. The 
covered dish event was at-
tended by about 75 persons. 

Coming from out-of-town 
were Mr. and Mrs. Harvey 
Wilson of Syracuse, N. Y.; 
Charlie Loeffelholz, Mrs. Ed-
wina Pettit, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Loeffelholz, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lynn Loeffelholz and chil-
dren all of Oklahoma City, 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Harrell 
of Conroe. Texas, Mrs. Hubert 
Spikes of Hartford, Alabama, 
Mrs. B e n Lutkenhaus of 
Lindsay, Mrs. Bill Kathman 
of Muenster and cousins from 
Valley View. Gainesville. 
Lindsay and Muenster. 

Big Changes Seen 
In 25 Years of 
Milk Production 

COLLEGE STATION - The 
old saying about taxes and 
inflation being the only things 
going up hits a sore spot 
with Texas dairymen. They've 
seen milk production shoot 
upward and have the records 
to prove it. 

Based on 25 years of re-
cords since Texas dairymen 
have operated under federal 
milk marketing orders, the 
milk production pioture has 
changed drastically, points out 
Dr. Randall Stelly, economist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service and the 
Texas Agricultural Experi-
ment Station. 

"The biggest change has 
been in the average milk 
delivery per day per producer. 
Back in 1951, Texas dairymen 
had a daily milk delivery of 
503 pounds. Today, that fig-
ure has jumped to 2.908 
pounds - almost a sixfold 
increase." 

Other changes have also 
occurred that reflect the cur-
rent demand for dairy pro- 

REAL ESTATE 
NEW HOMES: 3 & 4 bed- 

rooms. Priced $37,500 to $46,- 
500. 95'-1. financing available. 
Shag carpet, fireplace, ash 
cabinets. Frazier & Rodgers 
Construction C o., 665-5343, 
Gainesville Shopping Center. 

51-tf 

3 Bedroom 1 and Y., Bath, 
Living room & Den, Carpet, 
Brick, Carport, on 2 acres of 
land, Good water well, Peach 
trees, pecan trees, TV Tower, 
fence, 1800 sq. ft. metal 
building. Just outside city 
limits. Shown by appointment 
only. 

Don Flusche 
Real Estate Broker 

& Auctioneer 
759-2832, Muenster 

HOUSE FOR SALE: 2-story, 
3-bedroom. Henry Weinzapfel 
Real Estate. 759-2257 or 759-
4161. 30-H  

ducts. For example, the aver-
age butterfat content of milk 
delivered by dairymen in 
1951 was 4.28 per cent. Today 
that figure has dropped to 
3.69 per cent The average 
butterfat of Class I products 
(fresh milk) tested 3.74 per 
cent in 1951; now it tests 2.92 
per cent on the average. 

"And there's been a signif-
icant change in the use of 
Class I milk, notes Stelly. 
Whereas homogenized milk 
made up 86 per cent of all 
Class I milk in 1951, today 
this volume has dropped to 
just under 68 per cent" 

The biggest increase among 
fresh milk products has been 
in skim milk as Americans be-
come more diet-conscious, con-
tends the economist. In 1951 
skim milk made up less than 
1 per rent of all fresh milk 
products; today well over 19 
per cent of the fresh milk 
volume goes for skim milk. 
Flavored milk has taken a 5 
per cent jump to 7.7 per cent 
of the total volume of Class 
I milk while buttermilk has 
dropped sharply, from 8.58 
per cent to 3.3 per cent. 

"Prices have also reflected 
a sharp increase in the past 
25 years." says Stelly. The 
price for Class I milk with 
3.5 per cent butterfat is now 
averaging $11.31 per 100 
pounds compared to $5.65 in 
1951. The price for Class II 
milk (for butter, cheese, and 
related products) has more 
than doubled, from $3.72 per 
100 pounds to $8.36. And the 
blend milk price to producers 
is now averaging $10.65 per 
100 pounds, up from 5.59 
twenty-five years ago. 

"Allthough all this talk 
about the increase in milk 
prices might sound like dairy-
men are making lots of 
money. nothing could be far-
ther from the truth." Stelly 
quickly points out. "Major in-
puts in dairying -labor, feed 
equipment - have more than 
doubled during this 25-year 
period." 

The economist also notes 
that there have been other 
changes in dairying. All milk 
s old under federal milk 
marketing orders in Texas is 
now handled and assembled 
in hulk tanks. This procedure 
began in 1953 and the change - . 
over was completed 11 years 
later. 

Gallon-sized containers on 
the grocery shelf made their 
biggest jump in 1958 while 
secondary or private brands 
of milk took a sharp jump 
the following year. 

"Changes in marketing and 
packaging of milk will con-
tinue in the years ahead to 
meet consumer demands," 
contends Stelly. "T h e s e • 
changes will have a bearing 
on prices and production down 
on the farm." 

Buy, sell, rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads. 

ROOFING 
SHINGLES 

240 lb. seal-down 

$14.95 per sq. 
NATIONAL 

BUILDING CENTER 
Muenster, 759-2232 

PRE FINISHED 
PANELING 

in stock at 
Community Lumber Co. 

No. 1 Quality 

Alfalfa Hay 
For Sale 

ALSO 

CUSTOM HAULING 

Storm Shelter 
Fibre Glass 

WILDE 
East Hwy. 92 

Dankesreiter 
Garage 

General Auto Repair 

Air Conditioner Service 

311 Division St. 

Phone 759-4521 

Let Us Feed Your 

Cattle This Winter 
with 

PROLIX 
Liquid Protein Supplement 

. .. 35% protein 

. . No labor 

.. No waste 
. . Better calf crop 
. Economical 

NOW is the time to start 

Shawnee breeder range cubes also available 

at competitive prices. 

Muenster Milling Company 
Hours: Mon. thru Fri. 7:30 a.m. to 5 pm. 

Saturday 7:30 a.m. to noon 
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Carpet -:- Tile 	Linoleum 	Drapes 

MVO 
Phone 6687411, :212 East California 

Carpet...Linoleum...Tile 

Bruce Hardwood Floors 

Custom Drapery & Bedspreads 

Woven Woods 

Free Estimates 

AFTER (-> 
CHRiSTMAS 

CLEARANCE 
Now in Progress 

Many, Many Items 
1/2 price & less 

THE BAND BOX 
109 S. Commerce. Gainesville 

...a BEST BUY PRICES 

Specials for Dec. 30 & 31 

Pork Spare Ribs 	lb  75c 
Pork Loin Roast 	 lb 95c 
End Cut 

Pork Chops 	 lb. 99c 
Center Cut 

Pork Chops 	 I b $1.09 

Summer Sausage lb $1.59 
Chuck Roast 	 lb. 79c 
Arm Roast 	 lb. 85c 

CHOICE BEEF 
from our feed lot for your freezer 

Whole Carcass, Halves, Quarters 

We also will slaughter & 
custom process your animal. 

H &W Meat Co. 
Muenster, 759-2744 

I. 

ti  

itiESVILLE 

NOW IN PROGRESS 
Coats 
Dresses 
Sweaters 
Sportswear 
Robes 	 to 
Gloves 
Slips 	 1/2  
Panties 
Gowns 
Pajamas OFF 
Knit Caps 

All Name Brands 
No refunds or exchanges, please 

1/3  

47 hie a4itioot S Itop 
of Gainesville, Inc. 

113 E. California 	665-5771 
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half t i m e. Thereafter the 
Christians narrowed the gap 
to 44-40 at the third quarter 
and tied the score at 64 each 
just before the end of regula-
tion time 

Ending the first overtime 
the Big D boys did it again, 
knotting the game just as SH 
appeared to have it won. And 
the third time they were 
more dramatic about it. Trail-
ing by a point they got off a 
desperation shot just in time 
to be on the way when the 
buzzer sounded. It was a win-
ner putting t h e visitors 
ahead 79-78. 

In spite of the loss Coach 
Stock was erithusastic about 
the team. He said Tyler Street 
uses the football season for 
basketball practice and rates 
as a power house among the 
Metroplex teams. Staying in 
the game with it was a big 
achievement for Sacred Heart. 

Joe Hoedebcck led  the 
scoring with 28 points, Danny 
Stock hit 21, Brent' Hess 15, 
Glenn Walterscheid 10, Bob 
Hartman 4. 

Sacred Heart girls were 
more fortunate. Their oppon-
ent, playing the first season, 
showed inexperience, and the 
Tigerettes were in control 
throughout for leads of 14-12, 
32-21, 44-24 and 57-33. 

Scorers were Sharlene 
Pagel 24, Marlene Pagel 14, 
Liz Kralicke 8, Sharon Crew-
ing 7, Monica Gehrig 2, Toni 
Hoedebeck 2. Guards were 
Mary Luke, Dona Swirczyn-
ski, Brenda Voth, Marlene 
Swirczynski, Renetta Walter-
scheid and Janelle Hellman. 

Junior Varsity Tigers found 
the going somewhat tougher. 
They trailed all the way with 
the quarters ending at 11-6, 
27-13, 39-21 and 46-38. 

Ken Hartman scored 16, 
Mel Walterscheid 7, Mark 
Nasche 7, Angelo Nasche 6. 
Gene Luttmer 2. 

ELECTRICAL 
CONTRACTING 

Fixtures 
Supplies 

Residential, Commercial 
and 011 Field Wiring 
Installations, Repairs. 
Appliance hepalrs. 

Call 665-2721 
Nights call 

665-3263 or 6654458 

Parker Electric 
112 S. Rusk, gainesville 

 

CLEARANCE 

 

Now in Progress 	Ends December 31 

Open Thursday until 9 p.m. 

Coffee Tables, Sofa Table 

or End Table vta-, 
$89 to $299 Values 	Any in Stock 

only 1 cent 
With purchase of 

Any Sofa, Love Seat or 

Sleeper Sofa 

1 
10 0 off a4-il--- 1 /2 c J 

Owen Furniture 
103 W. Broadway. 665-6762, Gainesville 

2 blocks North of Courthouse 

Miller Cleaners 
329-31 N. Commerce 

665-3201 
Gainesville 

An Extra Service 
at no Extra Cost 
You can see and 

feel the difference. 
Homogenizes vital 

textile oil back 
into the fabric 

Muenster 
Livestock 
Auction 

SALE EVERY THURSDAY 

We offer our 
service to amidst you 
In buying or selling 

of live stock. 

Bill & Mike Hamer 
Ph.me 759-2201 

srEcua I 
at the Dairy Inn 

Mon., Tues., Wed., Jan. 3, 4 & 5 

Hot Dog 
39c 

Chili Dog 
Regular 55c 
Special 	  49c 

The Dairy Inn 
Phone 759-4512, Muenster 

Regular 45c 
Special 	  
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Local News 
BRIEFS 

Mrs. Florence Fisher had a 
Christmas dinner guests her 
mother Mrs. Mary Schmitz 
and her brother A J. Schmitz 
of Valley View. In the late 
afternoon she went to Fort 
Worth to observe Christmas 
with her daughters, Clara 
and Emma Fisher and re-
mained for several days. She 
returned to Muenster Tuesday. 

Guests of Joe and Alvina 
Voth for Christmas Day were 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Kindiger of 
Irving, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
O'Brien, Dennis and Billy of 
Irving, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Voth and Tracie of Gaines- 

vine, Mr. and Mrs. Jerome 
Voth and Cathy, Art and 
Steve Armstrong of Carroll-
ton, joining Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Voth, Leroy, Darren and Shari, 
of Muenster and Joan Voth of 
the home. Mr. and Mrs. Mark 
Voth were Sunday guests 
here. 

Children and grandchildren 
of Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Zimmerer home for Christ-
mas included their daughter 
Linda. first to arrive on 
Thursday afternoon and the 
Ray J. Zimmerer family and 
Richard Zimmerer family who 
came for Christmas dinner 
and remained through Sun-
day. Linda has a week of va-
cation with her parents. Clif-
ford, who is in the Air Forcc 
was unable to attend. 

The shrew eats the equiv-
alent of its own weight every 
three hours. 

Family Gathers 
At J. J. Haverkamps 

A family reunion was held 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs . 

J. J. Haverkamp on Christ-
mas Day. Children and grand-
children came for a noon 
dinner and most sta4d for 
supper. There was the tradi-
tional gift exchange, with vis-
iting and reunioning during 
the afternoon. 

Attending the covered dish 
event were Mr. and Mrs. Troy 
Cooper of Ardmore, Okla-
homa; Mr. and Mrs. Ferd 
Haverkamp and Leroy, Jim-
mie, Roney and Eddie of Car-
rollton, accompanied by her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Fran-
cisco Gonzalers of Honey 
Grove; Mr. and Mrs. Willard 
Zimmerer and Alan Karen 
and Brenda of Dallas; Mr. 
and Mrs. Ramie Hesse and 
Donna, Darrell and Loyd of 
Denison; Mr. and Mrs. Wally 
Luttmer and Bobby, Diane 
and Kenneth and Susie Zim-
merer, Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Luttmer' and baby daughter 
Marsha Mr. and Mrs. Roger 
Luttmer, Rose and Linda 
Kupper accompanied by a 
girl friend all of Lindsay; Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnnie Sturm of 
Gainesville; and Mr. and Mrs. 
Tony Luke and Frank, Mel-
vin, George and Mary; Ted 
Wiesman all of Muenster. 

Kenneth Luttmer, with the 
Marines, a son of the Wally 
Luttmers was on a 10 day 
leave and returned to his 
hate in California, Monday. 

Unable to attend were Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Sturm and 
baby daughter, Amy of 
Gainesville, Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Morey of Carrollton, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Pearson and Jeffre 
and Stephany of Lindsay and 
Eric Sturm of Gainesville. 

Joe J. Neu Family 
Assembles Sandal! 

A family reunion in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Joe J. 
Neu Sunday afternoon, De- 
cember 26 included all of their 
children a n d grandchildren 
and was held in Lindsay. 

Attending the  afternoon 
party were Msgr. Hubert J. 
Neu of St. Matthew's Parish, 
Arlington; 31r. and Mrs. Wil-
fred Bindel (Ida Mae) and 
Ben and Brian Bindel of 
Muenster; Mr. and Mrs. Mal-
colm Dennis of San Antonio; 
Mr. and Mrs. Lionel Garcia 
of Lewisville; Tim Bindel of 
San Diego, California; ,Guy 
Bindel and Lisa Pruitt of 
Wichita Falls; Mr, and Mrs. 
James Bayer (Ann) and Jim, 
Chris and Sandra Bayer of 
Gainesville, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Neu, Marilyn, Tom, 
Leslie, Diane and Donald Neu 
of Lindsay; Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Bengfort of Gainesville; 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Hoenig 
(Cecilia) and Carla, Aaron, 
Collette, Quintin, Shaw n, 
Mark, John and Gretchen. 

Also visiting with t h e 
group were Mr. and Mrs. 
Lawrence Zimmerer of Lind- 

Ken's Mobil 

& Drive-In 

Grocery 

Open 7 days 
a week 

Tigers Lose 79-78 
To Big D Team in 
Double Overtime 

Sacred Heart's Tigers looked 
like champions December 22 
as they lost 79-78 in double 
overtime t o Tyler Street 
Christian Academy. The game 
was a tense, action packed 
thriller in which the visitors 
came from behind to tie it 
twice and again in the second 
overtime to win by a single 
point. 

SH moved to the front 15-
12 in the first quarter and 
extended the lead to 33-24 at 

MHS Teams Drop 
Four of Six Games 
At Krum Tourney 

Muenster High basketball 
teams lost 4 of their 6 games at 
the Krum basketball tourna-
ment. The Hornets were wiped 
out in losses to Krum and 
Sacred Heart whereas Hor-
nettes lost their opener to 
Krum, then won over Sacred 
Heart and Prosper before be-
ing crushed by Ponder. 

In their opener the MHS 
boys trailed 44-10 at half time 
and took up some of the 
slack when Krum reserves 
took over. Final score was 
64-43. Lenzy Dyer was lead-
ing scorer with 10. Nick Wal-
terscheid made 8, Tim Wolf 
6, Terry Lewis 5, Phil Wolf 
6, Todd Richey 4, Neil Walter-
scheid and Danny Fisher 
each 2. 

The game with Sacred 
Heart was more of the some 
as the Tigers rolled up a 63-
24 lead in three quarters and 
coasted  to  the final count of 
73-38. 

Point makers for MHS were 
Tim Wolf II, Todd Richey 10; 
Nick Walterscheid 6, Phil 
Wolf 3, Terry Lewis 2, Bert 
Walterscheid 2 Donny Grew- 
ing 2, Danny Fisher and Dav-
id Felderhoff each 1. 

The Hornettes likewise were 
walloped in their opener, los-
ing to Krum 64-25. Scorers 
were Robin Walterscheid 12, 
Tracey Klement 4, Thelma 
Lewis 4 Sandy Schneider 4, 
Kathy Davidson 2 and Marla 
Sicking 1. 

That placed them iu the 
consolation bracket opposing 
Sacred Heart's Tigerettes. 
Starting with a 10-5 first quar-
ter lead, they gained in each 
remaining period by counts of 
23-16, 31-19 and 43-29. Tracey 
Klement led the scoring with 
37, Robin Walterscheid made 
4 and Sandy Schneider 2. 

The semifinal with Prosper 
was a hot contest all the way 
into overtime. Muenster took 
the first quarter lead 19-17 
and fell behind 29-27 at half 
time. At the third they trailed 
39-35 then tied it at 45 at the 
end of regular time. During 
the overtime MHS moved 
ahead to 51-47. Scorers were 
Tracey Klement 31 .  Robin 
Walterscheid 14, Linda En 
dres 4, Kathy Davidson 2. 

Then came the consolation 
final in which the Hornettes 
were clobbered 83-41 by Pon-
der. Muenster points were 
made by Tracey Klement 21, 
Linda Endres 11, Robin Wal-
terscheid 9. 

Just like a long letter from 
home, out of town relatives 
and friends appreciate read-
ing your news of family ga-
therings, school and church 
activities special milestones 
in family history. Please tell 
the Enterprise by phoning 
4311. 



Chapman's 
Semi-Annual 

First Pair 	 Regular Price 
Second Pair, or a Bag 

Of some value or less 	1C  

Boots, select group ... 40° , 0 off 

Chapman's Shoes 
111 N. Dixon, Gainesville, 665-4971 

Need vitamin C? 
Parke-Davis 
Vitamin C is 
high in quality 

in price. 
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Benylin 
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4 fl. oz. SI-59 

Muenster Pharmacy 

SALE 
Begins Wednesday, Dec. 29 

Sportswear Separates 

Lang & Short Dresses 

1 '2 price 
_./7-/-  

Sth -77 

Sportswear Separates, 
Dresses and Coats 

1/4 off 

BARGAIN TABLE 
Less Than Half Price 
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Where You Save DOES 
Make A Difference 

YOUR SAVINGS ACCOUNTS AT 

FIRST 
• 

ad-ree_ZA9.41. 

EARN THE HIGHEST INTEREST 
RATES ALLOWED BY LAW 

SAVINGS ACCOUNTS ARE NOW INSURED TO 
S4 0,0 0 0.0 0 

By The Federal Savings And Locm 
Insurance Corporation 

Compare These Savings Plans 
With Your Current Savings Plan 

See If You Are Getting 
'THE MOST FOR YOUR MONEY' 

TYPE 	 MINIMUM 
ACCOUNT 	RATE 	TERM  	DEPOSIT 

Passbook* 5.25% - 5.39%* Day to Day 	525.00 

Certificate 5.75% - 5.91%° 6 Months 	51,000 

Certificate 6.50% - 6.72%* 	1 Year 	51,000 

Certificate 6.75% - 6.98%• 2' i Years 	51,000 

Certificate 7.50% - 7.79%* 	4 Years 	51,000 

Certificate 7.75% - 8.06%* 	6 Years 	51,000 

*Passbook Accounts Pay Day-In And DayOut 
Interest. NO PENALTY For Early Withdrawal. 

'Effective Yield When Dividends 
Are Compounded Daily 

Federal Regulations Require That Amounts 
Withdrawn From Certificates Be Reduced 
To The Current Passbook Rate From The 

Date of Deposit, Less 90 Days Interest. 

DEPOSITS MADE BY THE 10TH OF THE 
MONTH EARN FROM THE FIRST. 

Phone 817-665-0316 
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Aa'a 	 !•47TS 

	  Fr.,ch Family is 
Home for Christmas 

isy 	 am. Mn. Hz-. 
Farah 

Thairsia, Mr 
idd Mn. Sob N:yes and :hit- 

	

and Chea 	 
f_771th. 	'Bard 	and Mn. 

as 3rMa 
mme from Ftor,, Or' 	 

1" -e, 

Ath thnimmi far Clat..-w--ite  

Lye mthe Mr arc Afra Etcr..4- 
 3faCd=e__  ct Maths 

;ariseMn..3ar_ce Mefaczen.: 
as' Go----_,my-Late nth a-wth- 

Sr-ith 	 Mr and 
MthsLawrth---ce =err arc 
Saa-,.. 	 if L. 

on 

Or Nacernbth 4 
Mr: 

	

xorSded the a--- 	-- 
a treat of Mae made 

thm connes pundr- 
rthdy and gi-=. Lesl..Ne mai 'nth 
mother preparers tne craft for 

day also which. when as- 
ser-bied as= am-eon-ye 
magnetic felt owl to hang on 
Mothers refrigerator FoCaar-
log the craft lesson. Me rids 
were even. der Solo rated 

books Sok rdght 
aw-ati which can be earned 
only by a hid year Bluebird_ 
It at doneL....L.idually and u 
an :tenth aiwcientere to com-
pithe the miceidary 
7-th gthis cent the =eying 
with the goodbye erg  and 

:Lomet,. lecnr- 
azz Mochths 

	

The Nom 	 to 
was Memel by Tonya rther. 
She was helped only a hale 
h.: her Mrs amch 
Fisheith. Tonya An been ythy 
May sae day before bal=g 
meth coothm ie Manes 

Lemmas :-..-_keys and 
gm' decorated than 

aeth colored ithog. On Thurs-
day thmtithig the prepared the 

before teaming fo-
sthcoi. By preceriedg and any-
Leg the 

	

- 	 - 

the Decemi, - 

work C.: a 
ortiect 

YOU CAN 

BANK 
ON m 

mods 
enceigia that these are sey-
thal unanswered questa:is, 
Krat. the accohnts are cie-
stained for the  enriiclriaah 
,ig...-rtine  for or jam- own 
re-Meer:eat who is net al. 
rthedy =de-  a retirement 
Man not chanting so d,_1- 

▪ Secandiy them 

Muenster 

State Bank 

Grewing Baptism 

_ _ 	M_7 

the J3-.- 
.-.‘f '7,7 	a - rr 

Father 
.±1..da:esni for 

-the ;::ermeiy Sac-ed Heart 
Chian: Goti-wirthtsir a 7 e 
Bichard. Greth- ,  and Mrs. 
Gene HoeciebecM A inIce----al 
aathering in the Wayne Crew-
ing home foaming the 
aaBt IF25 atter:sled by fia--aly 
mthnbers. 

HAMRICS 
Men's & Boys' Wear 

Th. Alec. d 9.3 km 
B•aaa• Va. ,Cmoso 

CCIS100 	 Levi. 

Van Hewea, Winobley, 

?d•ka**. radon, C=2, 
 Doosmoor. Tam Sae-yet 

•47...**Oecevie..e,0•••.esiaivIre-e 

400 Ill, S5.49 

Muenster 
Pharmacy 

Resethred Pita-- =2 

1
‘,

£1
1?4,

 

mid porrim 	the 	3-th 
mmtect. The he assembled 

=mass of nut ads 
- 	 construction paper Tbeme 

!L-s 	 perty r'roz 
_ - 	 nc-•  

-7 - - 	- 	be  - a  - 



Dial 

759-2833 

STORE HOURS 
Mon.-Fri., 8:30-8 

Saturday, 8:30-5 

Closed Sunday 

Gladiola 6 oz. 
Yellow 

Cornbread 
Mix 
17c 

Savory 18 oz . 

Red Plum 
Preserves 

49c 

Fine Fore. Grade A 
Extra Large 

Eggs 

doz. 93c 

Al= 

Great Northern 

Beans 

17c 

GIVE WINES & LIQUORS 

A nice variety of 

alcoholic beverages. 

most packaged for 

holiday gifting 

Also imported and domestic din-
ner wines. We will gladly help 
you select a proper wine for the 
occasion. 

Seventeen years of experience. 

82 Liquor 
John, Olivia, Albert, Tim, Pat 

Forestburg 
News 

By 

M11yrt 

Denham 

If anyone in the last few 
days has noticed Howard 
Sockwell chasing a hog around 
his place it is not that he is 
going into the hog business 
but trying to get it out. Nor is 
he trying to pen the hog but 
to run him off.. Howard took 
in this stray pig and fed him 
one time Well, enough said if 
anyone knows hogs. There is 
an old axiom about hogs —
if you have hogs running loose 
and want them to stay home 
you take them to a neighbors 
place and turn them loose. 

Montague County Food 
Show, Dec. 11 was well re-
presented by Forestburg. The 
girls had completed a six hour 
cooking prod ram with lead-
ers in the area. Six of the 
girls went on to fix dishes 
for entry in the food show. 
Felicia and Latricia Bell re-
ceived red ribbons, Maschelle 
Hudspeth and Jackie Farrell 
won blue ribbons. First place 
winners who will go to Dis-
trict Food ShoW in Dallas in 
the spring are Janice Lanier 
and Leann Hays. They re-
ceived medals and cookbooks 
in addition to their blue rib-
bons. A thanks from the com-
munity to Mrs.  Imogene 
Evans, Extension Agent, for 
helping the girls. 

The kindergarten thru sixth 
grade and teachers Mmes. 
Mary Hays, Lucille Williams, 
Vesta Carter and D. J. Rater 
presented their Christmas pro-
gram at the school Thursday 
night, Dec. 16. 

Several folks have inquired 
of me what Barney Brogdon 
is building in back of his 
house. Have no idea — but 
sure is a neat little building. 
Perhaps Barney wants his 
own little "Hide-away". Or 
is it a domino parlor? 

Mr. and MPS. Don McCand-
less and son Chris of Flaydada 
were visitors in the home of 
Don's grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. Ted Jackson Sunday, 
Dec. 19. 

It is with much regret that 
we report that Ruth Smith 
of the Fieeinound area, has 
been a patient in the Ardmore 
Memorial Hospital since, Dec. 
7. Ruth's many friends are 
keeping in daily contact with 
her and at this writing Ruth 
does not know just when she 
will be home again. 

Ross Littell of the Stoney 
Point Community, entered 
the Nocona Hospital Tuesday. 
Dec. 14, and underwent ma-
jor surgery Thursday am. 

Check Your 

You Gain Two Ways 
with INSULATION 

Your fuel bill decreases 

while your comfort increases. 

MEATS 

Slab Bacon 	98c 
Loan & Meaty 

 Spare Ribs 	49c 

Backbone 	69c 

Heavy Feedlot Beef 
Hamburger 	 lb. 49c 
Sirloin Steak 	lb. $1.19 
Seven Steak 	 lb. 79c 
Round Steak 	lb. $1.29 
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Kappa Theta Has 
Christmas Party 

A iic , Juh'ital Christ 	 par- 

Gasoline, Oil 
Supplies 

For Your 
Farm Needs 

Jimmy Lehnertz 
Gulf Distributor 

665-4562, Gainesville 

Or see local dealer 
Ferd's Gulf StatIon 

ty entertained members of 
Kappa Theta chapter ESA 
Sunday evening, December 5. 
This year the annual event 
was a progressive dinner for 
members and husbands. Hos-
tesses for the event were Betsy 
Fleitman, hors d'oeuvres; Lin-
da Siffle, salads; Sara Les-
ter, main dish; Joyce Mitchell, 
dessert. After dinner, the 
group met in the home of 
Linda Welch for the gift ex-
change and revelation of sec-
ret-sisters of the past year. 
New secret-sister names were 
drawn for 1977. It was also 
noted that "Little Miss" con-
testants participated in the 
Chrinnas parade by riding on 
the Santa Claus float. These 
girls were sponsored by ESA 

Felderhoff Baptism 
The baptism of Raymond 

Frank Felderhoff, infant son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Johis Felder-
hoff of Denton was held Sun-
day, December 19. at Im-
maculate Conception Church 
with Father Dan Williams of-
ficiating. 

The baby's baptismal spon-
sors were Mrs. Frank Felder-
hoff and Vincent Reinart. The 
christening dress and cap 
were made by Mrs. Reiner, 

Attending the  ceremony 
were Calvin Otto, Doug Otto 
of Irving, Helen Schumacher 
of Arlington, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dale Trevathan of Denton, 
Tim Felderhoff, MonaWalter-
scheid, Mark and Terry Fel-
derhoff and the grandparents. 
Mr. And Mrs. Vincent Reinart 
and Mr. and Mrs. Frank Fel-
derhoff. 

Following the church ser-
vice, the baby's parents hosted 
an informal family gathering 
in their home. 

—_- — 
Try 'em! You'll like 'em! 

Enterprise Classifieds 

KIRBY 
VACUUM CLEANERS 

Sales (S, Service 

835 E. California 

665-9812. Gainesville 

Pre-Christmas 
Reunion for Cains 

The family of Mrs. Rich-
ard Cain joined in an early 
Christmas dinner Sunday, 
December 18, in the home of 
a daughter and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmie Christian of 
Lewisville. 

Mrs. Cain and a 'grand-
daughter, 'Melanie Richey 
spent Saturday afternoon 
through Sunday with the 
Christians. 

Arriving Sunday for the 
covered dish dinner at noon 
were Mr. and Mrs. Bill Mc-
Collum and Kelley and Tra-
cey of Dallas: Mr. and Mrs. 
Wendell Richey, Robyrut Todd 
and Stephanie; Danny Fisher, 
Mr. and Mrs. Chris Cain and 
Christen Da Nae of Muenster, 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Trachta, 
DeAon and Cody of Norman, 
Oklahoma; Mr. and Mrs. 
Dickie Cain Tami. Tray. Scott 
and Shawna, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gene Hartman, Jeanne, Pam 
and Doug of Denton. 

A s guests arrived, they 
placed gifts for the gift ex-
change under the beautifully 
decorate d, white-flocked 
Christmas tree..Following din-
ner there was a family gift 
exchange. The afternoon was 
reserved for football on TV, 
dampened a bit by the Cow-
boys loss. 

Mrs. Ida Kuykendall will 
celebrate her 91st birthday, 
Dec. 24. 

Dec. 16. At this writing Ross 
is doing as well as can be 
expected. 

Joe Walters Have 
Christmas Reunion 

Members of the family of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Walter 
were all together for Christ-
mas for the first time in 
twelve years, in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Keith Clegg in 
Gainesville. 

Attending the covered dish 
dinner Friday evening were 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Walter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Graham, Kirk 
and Kyle; Mr. and Mrs. Wil-
fred Sicking, Tim, Gary and 
Nancy; Mr. and Mrs. Barry 
Blevins, Belinda, Tom, Mil, 
Joe and Susie of Odessa; Mr. 
and Mrs. Aubrey Chapman, 
Vallerie, Trey, Ann and Char-
les of Richardson; Dr. and 
Mrs. John Walter of Hous-
ton; Dr. and Mrs. Jim Wal-
ter and Rachel, Annah Alan, 
Sarah and Jacob of Louisiana. 

Others were Mr. and Mrs. 
Woodrow Clegg of Gainesville, 
Phil Clegg of Dallas; Mr. 
and Mrs. Weldon Clack and 
Janet, Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Sparkman of Gainesville; 
Nicholas Nagy and Shirley 
Streng of Lindsay. 

Santa Claus came in per-
son and there was also a gift 
exchange. The Joe Walter 
family's portrait was made. 

Relatives who remained for 
the weekend were Christmas 
night guests for dinner in the 
Bill Graham home. Also there 
were Mrs. Bobby Scoggins 
and Melanie. Leemy Sicking  

was another guest. 
Many of the same group 

will attend a New Years Day 
wedding m Odessa when Be-
linda Blevins is married to 
John Bailey Wheat. 

DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 

301 E. Broadway 
665-3521, Gainesville 

II no answer call 
665-2452 

Frigidaire 
Sales & Service 

Personality 
Furniture House 

Inc. 
2003 E. Highway 82 

668-8833 
Gainesville 

Muenster 
Bob Pols Registered Pharmacist 

Medical Center Bldg. 

'Pharmacy 

Gladiola 5 lb. 

Flour 

69c 

Griffin 32 oz. 

White 
Syrup 

79c 

Shop and Save Dollars at 

PAGEL'S STORE 
December 29, 30 and 31 

Jumbo Roll 

Paper 
Towels 

43c 

Chicken of the Sea, 

Light 
Tuna 

61/2 

 

or. 59c 

Bush 15 oz. 

Fresh 

Blackeye 
Peas 
17c 

Pringle 9 oz. 

Potato 
Chips 

75c 

Soothes 200 ct . 

Facial 
Tissue 

55c 

Town Talk 11/2 lb. 
Reg or San. 

Bread 

2 - 79c 

Foto Fare. 1 lb. 

Sugar 

89c 

ti 

ti 

ti 

• We Give 
S&H 

Green 
Stamps 

On all cash pur. 
chases, Double on 

Wednesday with E5 
purchase, excluding 

cigarettes 

CASH BEER PRICES, EVERY DAY 
Return bottles 
Old Milwaukee 	$4.19 
Throwaway bottles 

Old Milwaukee 
	

$4.94 
Cans 

Old Milwaukee 
	

$5.23 
Throwaway bottles 

Buckhorn _ _ 
	 $4.19 

plus tax 

Cans 
Budweiser 
Cans 
Coors 
Cans 

Schlitz 
Cans 

Pearl 	 

$6.19 

$6.19 

$6.00 

$5.55 

Bar-B-0 Beef 

Chopped, lb. $ I .49 Sked, !b. $ I.98 

BBQ Sandwich 	 es. 39c  

Hot ready to go 

Home Made Chili lb. 98c 

Potato Salad 	 lb. 59c 

Cole Slaw 	 lb. 59c  

National Building Center 
Phone 759-2232 	Muenster. Texas 



Public School 
Happenings 

Gainesville's only 
pharmacy with a 
druggist on duty 

at 7:30 am. 

Open 7:30 a.m. to 8 p.m. 

Wafts Bros. 
Pharmacy 

Gaine_ri I e 

Christmas vacation f o r 
M.P.S. students began on 
Wednesday, December 22, at 
2:30 p.m. The holiday ends on 
January 3, 1977. 

The football singles and 
group pictures are in. They 
can be picked up from Mrs. 
Perryman. 

The Muenster Public School 
Speech and Drama Club is 
reviewing scripts for U.LL. 
one-act play competition. 

The Senior class of Muen-
ster Public School received 
their pictures last Thursday 
The pictures were made by 
Marquis Studios of Enid, Ok-
lahoma. The studio represent-
ative, who photographed the 
seniors, was from Ardmore. 

The Muenster Public School 
Student Council held its mon-
thly meeting Wednesday, De-
cember 15, at 12:15 in the li-
brary. Sam Bright presided 
over the meeting. Pat David-
son called roll and read the 
minutes of the previous meet-
ing. Judy Fisher gave a treas-
urer's report. Albert Zimmer-
er reported on the bench 
committee's progress. Coun-
cil members decided to spon-
sor an assembly at the be-
ginning of district basketball 
action. L i s a Trubenbach 
brought up the subject of plac-
ing locks on students lockers. 
The meeting adjourned at 
12.30. 

The Muenster High School 
Chorus performed for the 
Soroptomist Friendship House 
in Gainesville Thursday, De-
cember 16. They sang a vari-
ety of Christmas songs for 
their first program this year. 
They were also featured at 
the High School Band's Christ-
mas Cioncert. 

— 
The F.H_A. chapter at M.H.S 

went Christmas caroling Mon-
day, December 20. They made 
baked goods to give to the 
patients at the hospital and 
rest home, where they sang 
popular Christmas songs. 

Students of Speech and 
Drama Club 
Muenster Public Sihool 

Classroom Teachers Meet 
Ken Fette, PTO president, 

was a guest at the regular 
meeting of Muenster Class-
room Teachers Organization. 
He spoke briefly, indicating 
willingness of the PTO to co-
operate with the teacher or-
ganization on improvements 
for the schooL 

Loretha Cash, Rudy Koes-
ler, Martha Koesler and Joni 
Sturm were named to a com-
mittee to plan a Christmas 
party for the faculty. Prue 
Selby presided for the busi-
ness meeting. 

Kindergarten 
Marcella Mullins who was 

6 on December 13, observed 
her birthday with her kin-
dergarten classmates Monday. 
Her mother, Mrs. Phillip Mul-
lins served refreshments of 
punch and cupcakes decorated 
in the Christmas theme. Spec-
ial treats were rings and pig-
gy banks. Marcella's brother, 
Darrell also attended. 

Kimberly Hess was the hon-
ored one when her mother, 
Mrs. Dennis Hess brought re-
freshments of cokes and cup-
cakes and treats of balloons 
for the morning kindergarten 
class on Friday, Dec. 17. Her 
6th birthday was the follow-
ing Sunday. Other guests 
were Kimberly's aunt, Mrs. 
Kenneth Bierschenk and her 
children Michael and Kristi 

Rhonda Stewart"s mother, 
Mrs. Raymond Stewart enter-
tained the afternoon kinder-
garten class on Friday, De-
cember 17, to observe her 6th 
birthday of December 18. Al-
so present was Rhonda's bro-
ther, Raymond. Refreshments 
we re cupcakes and punch and 
special treats were candy and 

135 at Hospital 
Christmas Party 

The staff 	I Muerster 
Memorial Hospital, employees 
and members of the hospital 
board and their spouses were 
guests of the annual Christ-
mas party Saturday, Decem-
ber 18, beginning at 7:30. - 

One hundred and thirty five 
attended the dinner-dance. A 
group of staff members and 
hospital personnel prepared 
the meal and Doug Martin's 
Rustlers played for dancing. 

Following dinner, a 5-year 
pin was awarded to Wilma 
Moseley of the housekeeping 
service and 10-year pins to 
Frances Yosten of the nurs-
ing service and Genevieve 
Pets of dietary service. 

Dr. Martin Kralicke was 
presented a 10 year pin and 
Hospital Board members Al 
Felderhoff, Rufus Henscheid, 
Albert Danglmayr and Ray 
Voth were given 10-year pins. 

Special guests were Dr. 
William Menzies and his wife 
of Wichita Falls and Dr. Elea-
nor Leevy and her husband of 
Dallas. 

Over 100 Attend 
Myra Club's Yule 
Dinner and Party 

Two events added to holi-
day festivities for members of 
the Myra Improvement Club. 
The Christmas dinner and 
party on December 14 were 
attended by 108 persons, be-
tween 5:30 p.m and 7:30 p.m. 
Special guests were the club's 
sponsors, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Hedrick. Co-chairmen of the 
event were Pearl Rosson, 
Aletha Livingston, Eulice Hud-
son and Mildred Fulton. 

Mrs. Lloyd Allen was also 
honored when club members 
surprised her with a decor-
ated birthday cake and pres-
ents. 

The Story Hour and Christ-
mas party for smaller children 
sponsored by the club, was 
held December 16, 2:30-4:30 in 
the afternoon. Twenty five 
children attended. During the 
craft period, they made Christ-
mas bells, using paper cups 
for the ,base. Stacie Sicking 
served refreshments. 

Later in the afternoon, more 
children arrived to greet San-
ta Claus who came with gifts 
for 41 youngsters. 

Mrs. Larry Vogel, Mrs. 
James Hacker and Mrs. Ray 
Sicking made party plans and 
arrangements. 

Buy, sell, rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads. 

- — 
Sherrills Entertain in Myra 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Sher 

rill and daughters Mary Ann, 
Sally and Vickie entertained 
members of her family with 
an early Christmas dinner 
and gift exchange Sunday 
Present were Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Benninger, Jan, Bridget and 
Tom of Humble, Texas, who 
spent Saturday through Mon-
day; also Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd 
Allen, Tim and Anita of 
Grand Prairie and Mrs. Sher-
rill's mother, Mrs. Ed Bennin-
ger, Sr., also of Grand Prairie. 
Unable to attend were Sue 
and Jerry Jeansonne and 
Laura, Gina, Jeff and Trisa of 
Littleton, Magsschusetts. Tney 
joined the reunion by phone 
during the family gathering. 

Henry Wiegman 
Family Gathering 

Children, grandchildren and 
great-grandchildren of Henry 
Wiesman were together for 
an early Christmas party Sat- 
urday, December 18. in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Leonard 
Yosten. Joining the honored 
guest, Henry Wiesman, were 
the Henry Yosten family, the 
Tony Koesler family, t h e 
Leonard Yosten family, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Steve Fisch 
and daughter of Wichita Falls. 

No one is sure who wrote 
"Adeste Fideles." Credit is 
usually given to St. Bonaven-
ture, this hymn was a great 
favorite of Teddy Roosevelt. 
Issac Watts composed "Joy to 
the World" in 1719; the music 
we know for the hymn was 
adapted by Lowell Mason 
from Handel's "Messiah." 

CLOSED TUESDAYS 

 

 

GOOD EATING 
Rohmers is widely known for a great selection 

of fine foods. Come and treat the family to oar 
salad bar, steak, sea food, barbecue or lunch, 

Rohmer's Restaurant 
Fmil and Agnes Rohmer, Muenster 

 

  

  

Year End Clearance 

SALE 
Wed.-Fri., Dec. 29-31 

Men's Suits 
	

Your choice S59.95 

Men's Sport Coats 
	

Your choice S35.00 

Men's Dress Slacks 	 _ '/s off 

Men's Sport Shirts . 	 V2 price 

Leisure Suits, 1 group 
	

V2 price 
Men's Sweaters 
	

Vi price 

Men's Jackets 	 off 

Men's Knit Shirts 
	

1/2 price 

Large group 
Boys' Casual Pants 	_ 	 V2 price 

Dress Shirts & Knit Shirts 
	

Y2 price 

Boys' Jackets, 1 group 
	

V2 price 

Boys' Jackets. 1 group 
	 1/4 off 

Boys' Casual Pants 	 _ 1/2 price 

Big $2 Table 
All Saii,s Coen & Final 

HAMRIC'S 

 

Ike r 	 joS Leaoscis you know 

Muenster. Texas 

 

The price of electricity 
must continue to go up. 
Texas Power & Light wants  
its customers to know why. 

GMCI 

Come and See the 
New 1977 Model 

PICKUPS 

Hoedebeck GMC 
759-4366, Muenster 

Since TP&L began operation 
almost 65 years ago, provid-
ing dependable electric ser-
vice at a fair price has been a 
constant aim. 
One measure of accom-
plishment of this aim is the 
fact that today, the average 
price of each kilowatt-hour of 
electricity supplied to resi-
dential customers is about the 
same as it was in 1951. 
In 1963 and 1965, TP&L made 
the eleventh and twelfth gen-
eral reductions in the price 
since it began operation. The 
average price of residential 
electricity dropped from 
about 4 cents per kilowatt-
hour in 1951 to about 2 cents 
per kilowatt-hour in 1971. 
Costs of producing and sup-
plying electric power began 
to go up at an unprecedented 
rate in the early 1970's. In 
1972, 1974 and again in 1975, 
it was necessary for TP&L to 

ask its customers to pay more 
for their electricity. The aver-
age per kilowatt-hour price 
rose from about 2 cents in 
1971 to about 4 cents in 1976. 
In the 1970-1975 period, 
TP&L's'annual expenditures 
for constructing generating 
plants, transmission lines and 
other facilities increased from 
$98 million in 1970 to $268 
million in 1975. These ex-
penditures are expected to be 
several billion dollars in the 
next 10 years. 
Fuels used to produce elec-
tricity cost $26 million in 1970 
and $147 million in 1975. The 
cost of fuels will be almost 
$200 million in 1976. 
Texas Power & Light will con-
tinue its efforts to provide you 
and all of its customers with 
dependable electric service 
at the lowest possible price. 
But, as our costs go up, so 
must the price of electricity. 

TEXAS POWER & LIGHT COMPANY 
A tax-paying, Invest0f-owned eleCtliC Way 
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Wishes Everyone a , 
, Happy New Year 	

, 

, 
, 

Lupe Evans, Owner 
Stir.. 	.  
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t  Whirlpool•,,! 
APPLIANCES 
SALES and SERVICE 
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6 	 Call Muenster Butane, 759-4411 
% 	or Cooke County Appliance, 665-0811 
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READ BOTH 

* YOUR HOMETOWN NEWSPAPER 
* THE DALLAS MORNING NEWS 
COMPLETE NEWS COVERAGE 

0,* • LOCAL • NATIONAL 
• STATE • WORLDWIDE 

SUVCRIBE TO TEXAS' FIRST METROPOOTAN NEMSPAPER 
ONLY $3.50 A MONTH 

mg PAO Morning Mug 
Cont., Your Local Dollar, Neon Distriboor 
Or Fill Ovr And MorM4, Hand, Covr.• 

CIRCULATION DEPARTMENT 
THE DALLAS MORNING NEWS 
COMMUNICATIONS CENTER 
DALLAS, TEXAS 75222 

Please start my subscription to The Dallas Morn-
ing News at once. I understand that the price is 
$3.50 a month. 

NAME 

ADDRESS 	 PHONE 

CITY/STATEI21P 

A TON OF WEIGHT 
WON'T SAG 
AN APACHE GATE! 

.....', 
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aPatto ashibtt nem at the 
ISoullwantam Si ,. Sham 

Put Apache long-sarvice features to work for you —
Exclusive full-hard spring ,steel for the ultimate In 
durability Hot-dip galvanizing to prevent corrosion. 
Tubular slide latch for ease of operation. Squeeze-
rivfted joints for maximum holding power. Bearing-
type, Pressed Steel Hinges for effortless movement 
and life-of-the-gate service. 

GATES OF INFERIOR CONSTRUCTION COST 
ABOUT THE SAME AS APACHE GATES SO 
WHY SETTLE FOR LESS THAN THE BEST, 

Community Lumber Co. 
Jerome Pagel & Body Klement, Muenster 
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Schmidlkofer Automotive, Inc. 
and Machine Shop 
The most complete and modem 

parts organization in North Texas 

Auto, Truck & Industrial Parts 

Store No. 1 Store No. 2 
835 N. Grand 302 W. California 

668-9241, Gainesville 6E5-1766 
Open 8 to 5 Gainesville 

Monday thru Saturday 
Glass bead machine Open 8 to 8 

Complete head service Monday thru Friday 
Block boring 

Hot vat service (about 
Open to 5:30 Sat. 

30 minutes) 
Hydraulic hoses 

Your speed and 
custom parts store 

Foreign Car Parts 

DIAMONDS ARE A GIRL'S BEST FRIEND 

See Jim or Randy Seed 

for all your Diamond Needs 

CLASS RINGS 

SEEDS JEWELERS 
307 N. Grand. Gainesville 

Master Charge 	 Bank Americard 

We Have Layaway or Credit Plans 

FEED YOUR CATTLE 
ON OUR RANGE. 

ACCO feeds 
cover the price range from 

quality .  to economy. 
The closer your pasture gets to winter, 

the farther it gets from supplying your cattle 
the nutrition they need. And the greater the 
danger of low conception rates and low 
weaning weights. 

So that's the time to move them onto 
ACCO's range—d hard working feed line 
that offers you high energy grain cubes at 
one end and an economical cube at the 
other. Arid they all contain added minerals 
and guaranteed vitamin A levels. That offers 
you a choice in balancing your cattle's 
nutritional needs. You can choose the 
ACCO Range Feed that best fits your 
pasture conditions. 

ACCO 32% Breeder Range Cubes. 
These high protein cubes are especially 
adaptable for feeding when you have an 
abundance of dry range grass or 
low-protein hay. They contain more protein 
and phosphorus than our 20% Breeder 
Cubes, and they are guaranteed to provide 
20,000 units of vitamin A per pound. 

20% Super Charged/Paymaster Breeder 
Range Cube's. These and 21% Breeder 
Range Cubes are low fiber, highly 

digestible, high energy cubes especially 
adaptable for supplemental winter feeding. 
They are fortified with phosphorus, trace 

■■■/%1111‘■1111.- 
ACCO FEEDS 

41.P'NMIT,7 

minerals and vitamins A, D and E. We 
guarantee 20,000 units of A per pound. 

20% Gro-Mor Range Cubes. During 
periods of drought or severe winter, your 
forage supply may become limited. Our 
Gro-Mor Cube is especially suitable for 
feeding under these conditions. It provides 
necessary protein and contains 20,000 
units of vitamin A per pound. 

Thriftmaster Range Cubes. When 
you need a feed that provides protein, 
vitamin A-10,000 units per pound—and 
trace minerals at minimum cost, this is the 
cube. It serves well as an economical.cube 
when grass is limited. 

And to offer you even more variety on 
our range, these cubes are available 
containing either all natural protein from 
high quality veaetable sources, or 
equivalent protein. 

The time to start feeding ACCO range 
supplements is before the grass becomes 
dry and limited—not after. So start planning 
now to give your herd a hand this winter. 

We know better than anyone that feeding 
conditions vary from ranch to ranch and 
season to season. That's why we offer such 
a variety to choose from. If you've got the 
cattle, we've got the range. 

Tony's Seed & Feed 
115 South Main -:- Muenster, Texas 

CLEARANCE 

30%0 

We celebrate the joy of living as 

we exuberantly greet the New Year! 

It's time too, to say thanks for 

your support in the year just past. 

Endres Motor Company 
Marty Element, Urban Endres, Muenster 

Report your news items to 759-4311. 
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Joe Hoenigs Have 	Sea birds are known to Here's a tip on how to keep 
drink salt water inp reference your teenage daughter out of 

Christmas Reunion to fresh. Land birds, however, hot water put sein e d i shes snes 
All of their children and need fresh water. 

34 of their grandchildren 
joined the Joe Hoenigs on 
Christmas Day. Six grand-
children were unable to at-
tend. There were 50 present 
for noon dinner and most 
stayed for supper. 

Together for the day were 
the Carl Pelzel family of En-
nis, the Rupert Hoenig fam-
ily of Carrollton, Mrs. Rita 
Cottle of Carrollton and Miss 
Kim Wilson of Dallas, the 
Raymond Hoenig family and 
the Richard Hermes family of 
Lindsay, Jerry Hoenig and son 
Billy of Charllet, North Car-
olina. 

There was a gift exchange 
following dinner, and guests 
entertained themselves 'situ 
table and card games and 

Jerry Hoenig will visit hit 
parents for a week and Billy 
will visit his mother in 
Whitesboro and friends and 
former- classmates here and 
his grandparents. They -are 
employed in the installation 
of Cable TV and will be 
transferred next week. 

Mrs. H. Sicking of 
Washington Visits 

Former resident Mrs. Hank 
Sicking and children Tiffany 
and Jason of Rochester, Wash-
ington were guests of rela-
tives here and in Oklahoma 
for an early Christmas visit. 

She arrived in Purcell, Ok-
lahoma, on December 15 to 
visit her parents, Mr. and 
Mr s. George Morgan, who 
brought her as far as Ardmore 
where she was met by Mr. 
and Mrs. Wilfred Sicking on 
December 18. After complet-
ing her visit here she and the 
children were again met by 
her parents in Ardmore and 
Wednesday night flew from 
Oklahoma City to Rochester . 

Hank's work in Washington 
prevented his visit here at 
this time. 

A , gathering of her hus-
band's relatives was held at 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Bobby Scoggins in Myra, with 
a gift exchange Sunday. At-
tending the covered dish din- 

Save Money! 
Save Time! 

Prescription Is Our 
Middle Mime. 

Shop the 
Drive-in Window 

for all your prescriptions 
and drug needs. 

WATTS 
Prescription Shop 

302 N. Grand, Gainesville 

nil' were the Glenn Cunning-
hams and Dalas of Montague, 
Mrs. Janet Crewing, Steve 
Sicking, Anna Mae Sicking, 
Jerry Downs of Fort Worth 
and the hosts and daughter 
Melanie. 

Accompanied by Mrs. Wil-
fred Sicking the guests vis-
ited relatives and friends in 
Gainesville and Muenster. A 
party in honor of Mrs. Hank 
Sicking was held one evening 
in the home of Cheryl Mol-
lenkopf. Guests were a num-
ber of former fellow em-
ployees of Rohmers Restaur-
ant. 

Local News 
BRIEFS 

Spending Christmas Day 
with the Leo Henscheids were 
a daughter and family Mr. 
and Mrs. Damien Hellman and 
Kevin, Linda, Donnie and 
Joey of Irving and a son and 
family Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Henscheid and children Jeff, 
Mark and Greg of Irving. 
Arriving Monday to visit her 
parents were Mr. and Mrs. 
Lenton McClendon of Dallas 
after they had spent the holi-
days with his parents in De-
vol, Oklahoma. 

Edd McGannon is a resi-
dent of Four Seasons Nursing 
Home in Hurst since Decem-
ber 18. His daughter Mrs. 
Reid Shanks helped h ire 
moves Cards will reach him at 
Four Seasons Nursing Home, 
7625 Glenview Drive, Hurst, 
Texas 76053. 

Guests of the R. N. Fettes 
were the David Fettes of Bel-
ton and Danny Fette, home 
for the semester break from 
Texas A and M. 

Holiday visitors with the 
M. F. Milners are Mr. and 
Mrs. Lawrence Milner and 
children John and Marc of 
East Moline. Ill., and Mrs. 
Margaret Haynes and children 
Marie, Kenneth and David of 
Saint Jo. 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Fetsch 
and Garry were among wed-
ding guests in Rhineland on 
December 18 when Laverne 
Fetsch of Rhineland was mar-
ried to Bill Funderburk of 
Commerce. 

Metzlers Host for 
Henscheid Reunion 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Metz-
ler and children Roy and 
Debbie hosted an all day 
Christmas reunion for mem-
bers of the Henry Henscheid 
family. 

Their guests were Mr. and 
Mrs. Mark Metzler of Farm-
ers Branch, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Metzler of Lindsay; Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Henscheid; 
Mr. and Mrs. Rufus Henscheid 
and John, Janet, Gary and 
Sharon, Mr. and Mrs. Ted 
Henscheid and Brad, Curtis 
and Amy; Mr. and Mrs. John 
Kelly and Matt and Laura of 
Fort Worth .  and Jeff Kelly, 
student in San Antonio; and 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Schu-
macher and Kathy, Steven 
and Douglas of Rhineland; 
also Mike Davidson of Muen-
ster. 

Luke Families Visit 
Holiday guests Saturday 

and Sunday with members of 
the Ben Luke family were 
the Harold Luke family of 
Arlington and the Bernard 
Luke family of Irving. They 
also visited their father in 
Muenster Memorial Hospital 
and joined local family mem-
bers for a covered dish supper 
Christmas night. Father Eu-
gene Luke of Subiaco arrived 
Monday-afternoon for his an-
nual holiday visit with his 
parents and returned Thurs-
day. Tuesday evening local 
family members gathered at 
the Dan Luke home for a 
covered dish supper honoring 
Father Eugene. 

Buy, sell, rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads. 

Safemark Tires & Batteries 
Sales and Service 

1.1,mbership Required) 

Unidyne Batteries. 6 & 12 volt in stock. from $22.95 

EZ Ride Shock Absorbers, heavy duty, late popu-
lar models in stock, $9.45 each. 

Multi-Mile Tires, some in stock 

Front End Alignment & Wheel Balancing 

Automotive Repair and Tune-up 

Radiator Sales & Service 

Michelin Radial Tires Available 

Knabe Tire & Radiator 
Phone 759-4141. Residence 759-2930 

305 N. Main, Muenster 

Regular $1.7 0  

Peanut Knee Hi's .... Now $1.25 
99 

Pant Sets 	 $8.89 to $17.49 
Vah 	'312. 99 

Warm Robes ... $11.89 to $13.29 
Regular $5.99 

	 Now $4.19 
Regular $R4Cir 

Coats 	 $12 	59 to $44.79 

mode ofday 
Ilse place Avg 41604440044 

105A E. California, Gainesville 

Attention Farmers & Ranchers! 
Free Removal of 

Fresh Dead or Disabled Horses & Cows 

Call Collect 817-665-0763 
Call as soon as possible for prompt service 

24 hour service 	7 days a week 

Gainesville Stock Removal Co. 
2 miles east of Gainesville ort Highway 82 

New modem facilities — Clean sanitary trucks 

Gowns 
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RED 
VYING 

KC Hall, Muenster 

Friday, Dec. 31, 91 
with music by 

Wilbur Matthews and The Vision 
S12.50 per couple for dance, food, party favors 

For Reservations call 
KC Club after 4 p.m., 759-2973 

Dale Klement, 759-4222 

New Year's Eve 

DANCE 

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Wil-
son of Syracuse, New York, 
are visiting her relatives her, 
for 10 days. They have been 
houseguests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Sandmann of Valley 
View, Mr. and Mrs. Louis 
Sicking of Muenster and Mr. 
and Mrs. Gus Lutkenhaus 
where they also spent Christ-
mas Day and accompanied her 
brother and his wife to Mid-
night Mass. 

Happy 
Birthday, 

Pop-o 
from Dy an 

Michelle 

Gene Hoedebecks 
Observe Thirtieth 
On Christmas Day 

A surprise observance of the 
30th wedding, anniversary of 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Hoede-
beck was the highlight of the 
family's Christmas reunion. 

Their special day began 
with the attendance at the 11 
a.m. Mass on Christmas Day, 
Joined by their eight children, 
sons-and daughter-in-law and 
four of the five grandchildren. 

After the traditional gift ex-
change and Christmas supper 
the Hoedebecks were sur-
prised with a special anni-
versary observance, gift s, 
champagne boasts and a dec-
orated anniversary cake. A 
special family gift was a 
shadow box with 10 areas for 
keepsakes: eight for their 
children, one for a child who 
died in infancy and one for 
the parents' wedding memen-
tos. 

The Gene Hoedebecks' eight 
children are Linda (Mrs. Gil-
bert Knabe), Paul Hoedebeck, 
Terri (Mrs.. Chris Cagle) of 
Irving, Peggy (Mrs. Wayne 
Grewing) Mary, Joe, Toni and 
Fred of the home. Grandchil-
dren are Ronnie. Brian and 
Cory Knabe, Jeff Hoedebeck, 
and Stephanie Ann Grewing. 

The loundest sound in the 
world is the first rattle in a 
new car. 

Insurance is sharing. To 
protect each of us from 
excessive financial loss, we 
share the burden thru our 
.nsurance premiums. We, at 
FMW Agency suggest ade-
quate insurance protection 
for a 

HAPPY NEW YEAR 

By Janet Henscheid 
What is more appropriate to 

our world that he w h o 
breathes, who exists, and who 
lives to make our world a 
better place? These words say 
it all. They tell us that the 
world depends on each and 
every human being made in 
the sight of God. 

Whether a child is born 
wanted or not, he is God's 
gift. This child has the right 
to become a person ... unique 
as his is . . and add his 
"little bit" to all humanity. 
When an issue is made, which 

Hospital Notes 
The following patients were 

dismissed during the past two 
weeks at Muenster Memorial 
Hospital. 

Tuesday, Dec. 14: Joe Knauf, 
Muenster; Mrs: Una Grammer, 
Gainesville; Mrs. Sam Cala-
brese, Valley View. 

Wednesday, Dec. 15: Tony 
Trubenbach S r., Muenster; 
Mabella Travelstead Gaines-
ville; Mrs. Steve Long and 
baby girl, Bowie; Mrs. Beal-
rix Reynolds, Forestburg. 

Thursday, Dec. 16: Mrs. 
Hester Payne, Myra; Mrs. 
Jerry Taylor, Saint Jo; Ronnie 
Westbrook, Nocona. 

Friday, Dec. 17: Aiigust 
Fleitman, Mrs. Lorena Taylor 
and Mrs. Agnes Seyler,-Muen-
ster; Mrs. Elizabeth Reeves, 
Forestburg, Ira Whitehead, 
Gainesville. 

Saturday, Dec. 18: Edd Mc-
Gannon, Muenster; Mrs. Mary 
Dennis and Mrs. Jerry Thur-
man and baby girl, Gaines-
ville: Donna Lutkenhaus, 
Lindsay. 

Sunday, Dec. 19: Henry 
Luttmer, Muenster; Mr. and 
Mrs. Allen Guthrie and Mr. 
and Mrs. J. C. Vollcrnan, 
Bowie. 

Monday, Dec. 20: Danny 
Dittman, Mesquite; Mrs. Mar-
garet Hillard, Nocona; Jerry 
Taylor, Saint Jo. 

Tuesday, Dec. 21: Charlotte 
Johnson, Muenster; Mar k 
Penner, Gainesville. 

Wednesday, Dec. 22: Mrs. 
Wayne Grewing and baby girl, 
Muenster; Mark Smith, Mari-
etta, Okla. 

Thursday, Dec. 23: Mrs. Mar-
jorie Zachary and W. C. 
Wheeler (Exp.), Saint Jo; Her-
bert Meek, Gainesville. 

Friday, Dec. 24: Clem Rei-
ter, Muenster, Herman Birkes, 
Gainesville; Robert Duncan, 
Nocona. 

Saturday .  Dec. 25: Melissa 
Matthews, Nocona: Mrs. Enloe 
Deen. Gainesville. 

Sunday, Dec. 26: Diane Yes-
ten, Dallas; Glenn Bewley, 
Forestburg. 

Monday, Dec. 27: Mrs. Susie 
Bowen, Saint Jo. 

makes it lawful to kill this 
unique infant by abortion, 
does it make it morally right 
also? No, it doesn't. 

What has become of the 
world's moral values? What 
kind of people are we becom-
ing that we can ignore the 
immorality of our own self 
made laws? Abortion today 
may not be illegal by law 
but by moral standards .it is. 
I cannot believe that anyone 
can ignore his own inner be-
liefs concerning what •is and 
what is not life, 

God made man, and gave 
each of us a purpose for hy-
ing. Man fulfills this purpose 
when he dies by God's plan 

. not by someone else's in-
human selfishness. When life 
is destroyed the whole world 
is affected, whether this per-
son was a young- child or an 
old person. When a baby is 
killed by abortion, it could 
be, for all we know, the 
most important person in the 
world . . . someone who could 
save us from war, someone 
who could bring world peace. 

Just as .a seed needS water 
and sun to grow, to bloom, to 
become the most beautiful 
flower it can; itist as the 
dark night needs the sun 
to start life again; so do we 
need each and every person 
made in the sight of God to 
help this world become its 
best. 

How can you kill an in-
nocent child by saying that 
he was not contributing to 
the best interest of human-
ity? This child has the same 
right to life as you and I. 
Think about a three year old 
and an eight year old. Would 
you do away with them be-
cause they are not contribyt-
ing anything? No you would-
n't. So why kill someone who 
has not even had the chance 
to look at the world. 

It's time for the world to 
wake up, to go by God's 
moral standards. It is not the 
fault of the child that he 
came to be, unwanted. His 
life was started through no 
choice of his. Shouldn't he 
be given the chance to fin-
ish it 

Guests of the Norbert Kle-
ments for the Christmas week-
end were their daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Otto and Lisa and Lori of 
Garland who were here Fri-
day through Sunday and al-
so visited his parents, the 
John Ottos. Christmas Day 
guests included two daugh-
ters and their families, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dickie Cain and 
Tami, Troy, Scott and Shawl. 
of Denton and Dr. and Mrs. 
J. E. Marc, Jimmy and Pat, of 
Fort Worth accompanied by 
his father We: Marc of Dall. s 

Confetti - - - 
in sight. America has every 
reason to go all out for both 
security and survival. 

Turmoil in various other 
places help to remind us that 
freedom is gradually being 
crowded out of the rest of the 
world. Angola has been taken 
over by a native tribe backed 
by Cubans and Russians. It 
amounts to another expansion 
of Soviet influence. A Is o 
Prime Minister Smith of Rho-
desia is about to negotiate the 
take-over of native tribes in 
that country, after which 
South Africa is in line for a 
similar take over. 

Meanwhile in many places 
the Reds are trying to spread 
their influence through legiti-
mate channels of government. 
They gained in Italy and ut-
most took control. Hopefully 
the Italians will do better 
next time and kick their reds 
out of government. To help 
them make up their minds 
on that subject they need 
only to recall the many other 
places that allowed the reds 
to have a part in government. 
Standard procedure for them 
is to gradually take over the 
whole show . . . and make 
it pet'manent. Dictators do 
not allow free elections en-
abling people to change back 
to their previbus form of gov-
ernment. 

As we enter the new year 
we need to understand the 
urgency of the outlook. Eco-
nomic and security consider-
ations both emphasize the 
need of dedicated, nation-
wide effort. We are at war 
even though no shot has 
been fired. 

Mr. and Mrs. Steve McEl-
reath and two children ar-
rived early Friday morning 
on a surprise 3 week visit 
from Spain to be with his 
parents, the Rufus McElreaths 
of Gainesville and other rela-
tives. 

Dorothy's 
Fashionette 

Beauty Salon 
Open Tuesday 
thru Saturday 

VICKIE KUHN 
DOROTHY MITCHELL 

665 - 9402 
303 S. Chestnut 

Gainesville 

Beauty Is not a Gift, 
It's a Habit. -  

Abortion and Morality 

equipment 
operators! 

F MW 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

Ju9 
814 759.2257 

0. 

Winners of the essay contest on "Abortion and Morality" sponsored by the 
Knights of Columbus, receive their awards from Dale Klement, grand knight of the 
Muenster K of C contest. They are Janet Henscheid (center) first place, Monica 
Gehrig (right) second place, and Gary Rohmer (left) third place. Receiving honorable 
mention for excellent essays were George Luke, Roger Haverkamp and Cheryl Luke. 

Hero's • soot's boot 
every step of the wayl 
Rugged, handsome, 
reedy for • rough day'. 
work anytime. P'..nry 
the feet, too. Stop in — 
try ea Pecos by Red 

and be comvinced I 

LOST 
LUGGAGE 

209 N. Commerce 
Gainesville 

immiimmismilmn■• =omenwenmommlimmom 

1 

Piano Tuning 

and Repairs 

See these and more at 

The Musique Shoppe 
105 N. Dixon, Gainesville, 665-0391 

Inlook Outlet of Gainesville 
Formerly Wecuhouse Outlet 

SPECIAL HOLIDAY SALE 
Fall Ready-to-Wear 

'/2 off 
Large selection, long and short 

PARTY DRESSES 
Juniors 3- 13, Misses 6-it, Half Sizes 14!2-241/2 

See Our New Spring Fabrics 

The Inlook Outlet 
Store Hours: 9 to 5, Mon. thru Sat. 

114 N. Commerce, 668-8351, Gainesville 

[mas-7-tet:haTrge 

You still have time to 

Make Reservations 
for New Year's Eve 

The 
Ranch 

Friday and Saturday 
Dec. 3I and Jan. I 

Tus: 
The James Buck Band 

Reservations will be held 
until 7:30 p.m., call 759-2993 

Every Tuesday & Thursday 

Is Ladies Night 
Free Refreshments for ladies & 

Free Music for Everybody ' 

THE 

THEATRE 

V V "The Amazing Dobermans 
Rated G 	 Features 7:30 & 9:10 

Rated PG 

tSitnine■ 	 
Show Time 11:30 p.m. 

In Gainesville 

NOW PLAYING 

New Year's Eve Preview 

"Car Wash" 

For reservations call 
Mrs. Charles Bayer, 759-2767 

Ringing inihe 
ewYear with us! 0; 

DANCE 
at the 

SH Community Center 
New Year's Eve 

Party Favors Will Re Provided 

Music by 

LARRY FINCH 
and Southern Comfort 

A very popular 5 piece band horn Oklahoma City 

W. Bindels Have 
Yule Get-Together 

Visiting OS,' the Christmas 
holidays in the Wilfred Bin-
del home were their children 
Mr. and Mrs. Mac Dennis of 
San Antonio Mr. and Mrs. 
Lionel Garcia of Lewisville, 
Tim Bindel of San Diego, 
California: Guy Bindel and 
Lisa Pruitt of Wichita Falls 
joining Ben .and Brian of the 
home. 

Cynthia and Malcolm Den-
nis spent several days here 
during a week of vacation 
from classes. He teaches Math 
at Sam. Houston High and 
she teaches Math at Wheatl6y 
High in San Antonio. 

Tim Bindel is on leave from 
the Navy until January 12. 

The only way on earth to 

multiply happiness is to divide 
it. 
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