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A few weeks ago when the boys
at Munda were advancing at the 
rate of only a hundred yards a day 
you may have wondered why so 
slow. I did. And now I have an an­
swer. The problem cleared for me 
as I was taking my second trip 
through Fort Sill’s battle inocul­
ation course. It’s a day’s work just 
to move a hundred yards like that, 
regardless of whether a fellow 
does any fighting.

From what they are saying 
around here that little trip under 
the bullets has become a standard 
feature of training in almost every 
camp. Well, nothing could be bet­
ter. Besides furnishing a thorough 
workout it gives valuable practice 
in keeping down, all the way down, 
while moving forward. And should 
it develop that a person will not 
need the practice, at least he will 
have acquired some appreciation 
of what the boys at the front go 
through. He'll heartily agree that 
Sherman was right.

The course this time was differ­
ent from that we went through a 
few months ago. And as much 
tougher as it was different. That’s 
how it seemed, although I must 
admit that the season and the 
time of day may have had some 
effect on my opinion. You can 
imagine what it was like at 2PM 
on ground that had not felt a drop 
of rain in weeks.

The procedure, in case you are 
interested, is something like this. 
Sneak up in a trench until about 
forty men are abreast, then peek 
over into the business ends of a 
couple of machine guns about 75 
yards ahead. Just behind them is 
a ridge of dirt, the objective that 
must be reached strictly by hor 
izontal locomotion. Between heje 
and there are a few barbed wire 
entanglements to make the ad­
vance more realistic — and harder

Then a loud speaker blares out
“over the top”, and you’re off, 
slithering over the edge of the 
trench as flat as a snake. It does­
n’t take but a moment to realize 
that this is anything but fun. So 
you decide to snap it up and get 
out of the misery. About 30 yards 
up the line you begin to notice 
that it’s work, hard work, and that 
you can’t possibly keep up the pace 
So you start slowing down.

You’ve already passed a couple 
strands of barbed wire that some 
fiend deliberately neglected to re­
move after completing the other 
entanglements. No matter how 
low that stuff is, you go under, 
not over. And while doing it you’re 
inching along by squirming on 
your back. That way you can pick 
off any strand that happens to 
snag on your clothing. Most likely 
you’re lifting it up all the time 
while wriggling under. Same is 
true of the regular entanglements, 
only more so. There are more 
wires to contend with.

About half way along you not­
ice that you're tired and winded. 
Breathing is spasmodic and mus­
cles ache terribly. You’ve got to 
rest a while. But you can't lie quiet 
The ground is so hot you can feel 
yourself toasting.

The farther you go the worse
it gets. You’ve accumulated a 
throat full or dust. So you cough, 
and a cloud of dust flares up in 
your face. Half of it seems to go 
into your eyes and the other half 
right back to your throat. You 
also start to feel bruises on your 
chest from the dozens of rocks 
you’ve skidded over. Another case 
of fiendish failure to clean up. 
And you also begin to notice the 
skin peeling off your elbows or 
knees. The spot affected is deter­
mined by an individual’s method 
of applying traction in his loco­
motion — whether he’s mostly 
pushing with his legs or pulling 
with his arms.

All the while the guy at the loud
sneaker has been yelling his head 
off. “Don’t lift that wire so high, 
you’ll poke your hand into a bul­
let. Snap it up. Wait to get home 
before you take a nap. Get off 
your knees or you’ll be picking 
lead out of your rump” . You get 
so you hate him.

Toward last you’re dimly aware 
of going forward in a semi-blind 
stupor. But eventually you reach 
the finish line, roll over, struggle 
to your feet, and begin stumbling 
in the general direction of shade 
or drinking water.

What a relief to relax! You 
don’t bother with such trifles as 
dust dimmed eyes, aching muscles, 
raw spots, or streaks of mud on 
face and clothing — mud that was 
made by the mixture of dust with 
your sweat. If you went through 
with your shirt tucked inside 
your trousers you are also aware 
of a few handsful of grit you’ve 
scooped up along the way. But 
you don’t notice any of that. All 
you think of is water and rest.

And, naturally, you start wond­
ering whether you'll survive the 
second trip. That’s right. You’re 
only half through. The ordeal 
just completed was a dry run, for 
practice, so that you‘ll know how 
tb att when the guns are pptfpihg, 

(CbmYwn*! »n PBi* O

Muenster Enterprise

OUR 80VS 1
c o io mWITH THI

Home From War Theatre
S. Sgt, Roman Trachta is here 

since Saturday on furlough to vi­
sit his mother, Mrs. Annie Trach­
ta and other relatives. He returned 
to the states two weeks ago after 
spending more than a year in the 
Asiatic Pacific with a medical div­
ision. He leaves Monday for Camp 
Barkeley where he will enter OCS 
in Administrative Medicine. Ro­
man says very little about his ex­
periences overseas and adds that 
his activities were such as can­
not be published due to military 
censorship. The course he is to 
take will require approximately 
four months and he looks for­
ward to more overseas duty at its 
completion.
Transferred To Georgia

Sgt. Alois Rohmer was last week 
transferred from Los Angeles to 
Fort Benning. Ga., he has writ­
ten his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Leo 
Rohmer.

Accepted For Navy
Lawrence Roberg, son of Mrs. 

Katy Roberg, left Thursday of 
this week to join his brother, Louis 
in the Navy. He passed his physi­
cal at Dallas last Wednesday. Also 
taking physicals at Dallas the 
same day were Walter Richter and 
Leroy Sicking, who were rejected.
Writes From Sicily

S.Sgt. Ferd Yosten, writing from 
Sicily, reports that he is fine and 
that his new station is a welcome 
change from the desert sands of 
Africa, where he spent several 
months. He is with the air corps 
as a mechanic.
Truck Farmer In New Guinea

Sgt. Earl Lehnertz, stationed in 
New Guinea, reports this week 
that his duties are changed from 
cook to “plain old plow jockey” . 
He explains by saying: “ I am now 
in charge of a vegetable farm; 
you should see it. The Victory gar­
dens you folks in the states brag 
about have nothing on this. We’re 
feeding the boys lots of radishes, 
string beans, and similiar vegetab­
les, and cucumber and watermel­
ons will soon be in. I have two 
tractors and plenty of natives to i 
help gather the vegetables.” Earl ’ 
concludes his letterr which was | 
written to the Enterprise by add­
ing : “Keep the papers coming for 
me to read and give my love to all” 

------------v------------
NEWLYWEDS LEAVE FOR 
FLORIDA HOME TUESDAY

Coast Guardsman and Mrs. 
John H. Wimmer left Monday for 
Panama City, Florida, where they 
will make their home at 608 Har­
rison Ave., as long as he is stat­
ioned in that city. The couple was 
married here on August 10 while 
he was on a 15-day leave. For 
traveling Mrs Wimmer wore a two 
piece suit of navy blue crepe with 
matching accessories and a cor­
sage of pink and white carnations. 
She is the former Miss Olivia Wal­
ter scheid.

On Sunday evening they were 
honored with a barbecue supper 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Mar­
tin Bayer. Other guests were Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Walterscheid, Miss 
Katie Mae Walterscheid and Mrs. 
Joe Bayer and Family.

----------------V----------------
Mr. and Mrs. Ben Seyler re­

turned last weekend from a trip 
up north and were accompanied 
home by six-year-old Billy Taylor 
whom they have adopted. The 
handsome blonde youngster needs 
no official introduction. He re­
sided here last winter with his mo­
ther and the Seylers tried at that 
time to adopt him but were not 
successful because the mother was 
unwilling. She moved to Peoria, 
111., and finding that she was ab­
solutely unable to care for the 
child wrote the Seylers to come 
for him. According to Illinois state 
laws a period of six months is re­
quired before final adoption pa­
pers can be completed. Billy 
says he hopes he never has to 
leave again, that he loves the 
Seylers and his new home and 
that he doesn’t want to go away, 
ever.

Mr. and Mrs. M.J. Endres were 
in Fort Worth Sunday to attend 
religious services at which their 
daughter. Sister Irma, took her 
perpetual vows. They were accom­
panied home by both daughters. 
Sister Irma and Sister Agnes, who 
spent until Wednesday evening 
here with their parents. Sister 
Agnes has recently returned from 
Washington, D.C., where she at­
tended summer school. She will 
teach in Dallas again this year, 
and Sister Irma will teach in Fort 
Worth.

Gas Rationing 
Cut Began In 
Texas Monday

Beginning Monday Texas mot­
orists get only three gallons of 
gasoline for each ration coupon, 
either A, B or C, instead of the 
customary four gallons.

There have been many protests 
of the reducing of the value of 
coupons, and few Texans pretend 
happiness over the order forcing 
them to conserve a product with 
which Texas abounds.

“ Fill ’er up’’ orders boosted gas­
oline sales locally Saturday as 
motorists drove into service stat­
ions to cash in coupons while the 
four-gallon ration remained in ef­
fect.

Importance of accepting only 
endorsed coupons when making 
either retail or wholesale sales 
has been stressed again by OP A, 
and dealers were warned also not 
to acept loose coupons. They are 
also told to report all overage to 
the board. Overage, it is explained, 
applies to selling portions of cou­
pons, for example, selling ten gal­
lons and collecting four tickets.

Under the new plan, one gallon 
of the gasoline should be used for 
occupational driving and two gal­
lons for non-occupational. At pres­
ent, of the 16 gallons a month 
allowed on the A card, six gallons 
are considered non-occupational.

The maximum amount which 
will be allowed motorists needing 
their cars in the “course of work” 
will be cut fron 1720 miles a 
month to 480. This does not affect 
preferred motorists such as doc­
tors, ministers and war workers, 
who receive C cards according to 
actual need but without a spec­
ific limitation.

“A” book coupons No. 7, now 
good for three gallons, must last 
through September 21.

------------v------------
MRS. J.B. W ILDE IS
REELECTED TO  STATE
LEAGUE OFFICES

Mrs. J.B. Wilde of this city was 
re-elected to both her offices in 
the Catholic State League during 
the forty-fifth annual convention 
at Seguin on August 10 and 11. 
She is state treasurer and treas­
urer of the Women’s Section.

Frank C. Gittinger of San An­
tonio was elected president re - ' 
placing Joseph Molburg, and Wal­
ter Albrecht, San Antonio, was 
re-elected secretary. Castorville 1 
was chosen as next year’s conven­
tion city.

Seguin was host to approximat­
ely 30 priests and 250 delegates 
and visitors for the annual meet­
ing last week.

Attending from Muenster were 
Rev. Father Richard, Mrs. Wilde, 
Mrs. Joe Luke, John Klement and 
Victor Hartman.

----------------V----------------
SURPRISE PARTY GREETS 
THE ALBERT HENSCHEIDS

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Henscheid 
were honored with a surprise par­
ty last Thursday evening at their 
home in observance of their 19th 
wedding anniversary. Their daugh­
ters, Misses Clara and Rosalie, and 
Mrs. Frank Schilling planned the 
affair for which approximately 
100 relatives and friends were 
guests.

For the honor couple the party 
was a complete surprise. They 
were supper guests of Mr. and Mrs 
Frank Schilling and considered 
that a very pretty compliment, an 
anniversary dinner in their honor. 
At a time, pre-arranged by their 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. Henscheid 
were telephoned to come home. 
When they arrived they found all 
the guests, laden with refresh­
ments and gifts in keeping with 
the occasion.

Games and music were enjoyed, 
after which lunch was served. Mu­
sic was furnished by Miss Veron­
ica Yosten, Piano; Henry Yosten, 
accordion; and Buddy Yosten, 
guitar.

Personnel included the follow­
ing and their families: Messrs,
and Mesdames John Rohmer, Aug­
ust Walterscheid, John Felderhoff, 
Nick Yosten, Joe and Meinrad 
Hesse, Leo Henscheid, Walter 
Klement, Felix Yosten. Henry Hen 
scheid, R.R. Endres, Frank Schil­
ling. Lawrence Wimmer and Ed 
Roberson of Gainesville. Frank 
Yosten and family, Mrs. Anna 
Wiedemann, Miss Theresa Hesse. 
Bill Henscheid and son, Werner 
Miss Evelyn Wiesman, Pfc. John­
ny Durbin of Camp Howze. Char­
les Swafford, .Norbert Koesler. 
Werner Cler and Mrs. Aubrey Jen­
nings and son, the honorees and 
their family.

Mr. and Mrs. Henscheid were 
married here on August 12, 1914 
She is the former Miss Dorothy 
Hesse. They reside on a farm north 
of the city, and are the parents 
of 8 children.

---------------V----------------
Mrs. Charles Cler and soh. War­

mer, and Miss Armella Yosten, 
WfcW in. Fort Worth SiXntiay To 
visit Mites Lucille Cler.

AV IA TIO N  CADET

3
—At the midway mark in the last 
lap of his training as a pilot in 
the army air corps is Aviation 
Cadet Patrick Stelzer, son of 
Gregor Stelzer of this city. He 
entered the service in February, 
1942, and was stationed at Camp 
Wolters, as a cook for almost a 
year, then volunteered for the air 
corps and was accepted as a cadet. 
He trained at Goodfellow Field, 
San Angelo, and is now complet­
ing his course at Brooks Field, 
San Antonio.

Funeral Services 
Held Monday For 
Mrs. John Luke, Sr.

First 1943 Cotton

Muenster'* first bale of cotton 
for the 1943 season was brought 
in this Thursday morning by the 
Cler Brothers. It was grown on 
their farm north west of the city 
and was ginned by Muenster Gin 
Company.

SUGAR STAM P NO. 14 
GOOD FOR 5 POUNDS 
MUST LAST THRU OCT.

Sugar stamp No. 14, good for 
5 pounds, became valid Monday, 
August 16 and remains valid thro­
ugh October. Stamps Nos. 15 and 
16 are still good and remain valid 
through October 31 for 5 pounds 
each for home canning purposes. 
Housewives may apply to their 
local ration boards for more if 
necessary.

Shoe stamp No. 18 <1 pair* is 
valid through October 31.

Meats, etc. — Red stamps T, U 
V and W now valid, expire Aug. 
31.

Processed foods — Blue stamps 
R, S, and T remain valid through 
September 20.

------------v------------
NOTHING UNLUCKY 
ABOUT THIS 13TH

Who ever said anything about 
Friday the 13th being unlucky? 
That’s what Pfc. and Mrs. Hugh 
Jackson want to know. For them 
both Friday and 13 are lucky. 
Their first child, a 9pound boy, 
arrived at the local clinic last Fri­
day, August 13. Incidentally the 
proud father was also born on 
Fridav the 13, in 1913. He spent 
Friday. Saturday and Sunday here 
with his family, returning to 
Camp Wolters Sunday evening.

The baby was baptised Sunday 
afternoon in Sacred Heart church 
by Father Thomas and received 
the name Joseph Arthur, being 
named after his two grandfathers. 
The maternal grandparents. May­
or and Mrs. J.M. Weinzapfel, were 
sponsors and the infant wore the 
long dress, with its lace and in­
sertion petticoats, in which his 
grandfather Weinzapfel was bap­
tised 49 years ago.

------------ v------------
Mr. and Mrs. J.B. Wilde and 

daughters drove to Camp Maxey 
Sunday to visit their son and bro­
ther, Pvt. Ray Wilde, who was 
recently transferred to that camp 
from Abilene. Ray accompanied 
them home in the afternoon to 
spend several hours here and was 
driven back in the evening by his 
sisters and a group of young 
friends.

Guests of Father Thcmas last 
Wednesday to Saturday were his 
hrnther. Martin Buergler and son, 
Herman Joseph, or Fort Smith, 
Ark. Friday, joined by Father 
Richard, the grouo visited in Gain 
esville, Lindsay, Wichita Falls and 
Windthorst. Herman Joseph is en­
tering Sublaco Monastery this 
week. He joins two brothers study­
ing for the priesthood._

Mrs. John Schmitz underwent 
a major oeration at Saint Paul's 
hospital in Dallas last Thursday. 
Her husband and daughter, Mrs. 
Joe Wimmer, were with her at tljf 
time and on their return home 
renorted that she was resting well. 
They visited her again Sunday 
and said she was recovering nor­
mally. She will remain In the hos­
pital'for another week, at least,

peitry Harrison of, Archter City 
spent last Sunday with his biwier 

Alford RaVrlSon.

M ercuryDrops 
To Season’s 
First Norther

44 Degree Change N oted;
Strong North W ind Drive*
A w ay Badly Needed Rain

Climbing to 112 degrees, to set 
the summer’s record, Monday’s 
scorcher melted away in the late 
evening before the season’s first 
norther. Tuesday a.m. readings 
were 85, and on Wednesday morn­
ing Muensterites were shivering 
at 68 degrees. With the mercury 
registering well above the 100 
mark for weeks the sharp decline 
sets the coolest weather Muenster 
has had since early July. Hopes 
for rain, badly needed, faded as 
the sky continued clear and un- 
couded.

The dry -weather promises 
the earliest cotton crop in about 
10 years. Cotton has held its own 
quite well in spite of no appreciable 
rain since early July and only 
small reserves of subsoil mositure. 
The plant, however, has quit grow­
ing, and bolls are popping open, 
most of them unmatured. Reports 
are that farmers will be gather­
ing the crop before the end of 
the month. Reports also indicate 
Uhat most cotton will be pulled 
because bolls are small and have 
opened before fully developed. A 
farmer near Forestburg reported 
about three bales open In his field 
this week.

The Muenster Gin is being re­
paired and remodeled for the ap­
proaching season. Cooke County’s 
first bale was ginned at Valley 
View Friday and the second, 
grown in the Bulcher community, 
was ginned Saturday at Gaines­
ville.

The continued dry, hot weather 
is responsible for a drop in milk 
receipts at the local cheese plant. 
Dally average the first three days 
of the week was 32,000 pounds, 
the lowest of the season. Receipts 
dropped consistently since early 
June when the year’s high of 48,-
000 pounds was recorded.

Meanwhile farmers are still
waiting for rain so they can plow. 
Most of those who tried it during 
the past weeks gave it up as a bad 
job. /

------------v------------
LOCAL GROUP ATTENDS 
ANNUAL 4-H PICNIC

More than 100 women and girls 
affiliated with home demonstrat­
ion and 4-H clubs of Cooke County 
enjoyed the annual rally and pic­
nic held last Thursday at the T.B. 
Davis farm east of Gainesville.

The morning was spent in reg­
istration and renewing acquain­
tances, at noon a sumptuous pic­
nic lunch was spread and the af­
ternoon was devoted to. games, 
contests and a program.

Muenster girls appeared on the 
! program. Coralee and Rosalee 
Fuhrmann gave a vocal duet and 
Bernice Reiter and Tresa Ann 
Hess appeared in a song with 

I Patsy Miller of Era.
In a horse shoe pitching con- 

i test, between the women and the 
i girls, Coralee and Rosalee Fuhr­
mann held their places in the 
girls’ section as winners but were 
defeated by the women in the 

, finals.
During the afternoon Miss Nette 

Shultz, county agent, presented 
! the gold star award to Miss Patsy 
j Sullivan of Whaley 55 club, for 
high ranking 4-H work done dur- 

j ing 1942.
1 Attending from Muenster were 
Sponsors Mrs. J.M. Weinzapfel

| and Miss Olivia Stock and Mrs. 
M.J. Endres and Eileen Koelzer, 
Rosalee and Coralee Fuhrmann, 
Agnes and Philomina Felderhoff,

, Olive Haverkamp, Edna Margaret 
| Hartman, Dolores Gremminger,
, Mary Ann Felderhoff, Bernice 
Reiter, Joan Swirczynski, Pauline 
and Clara Mages, Tresa Ann Hess 
and Tresa Rohmer.

Also in attendance were Mrs. 
Ben Sicking and daughter, Miss 
Rose and Miss Willie Sowder. 

------------v------------
SURPRISE PARTY GREETS 
MRS. PATRICK ON BIRTHDAY

Mrs. J.W. Patrick was honored 
with a surprise picnic and bar­
becue party last Thursday evening 
at the Bill Mathews ranch near 
Myra in observance of her birth- 
d&v. Friends planned the affair.

Personnel included Messrs, and 
Mmes. J.W. Patrick. Woody Chap­
man. L. Burchftelj Bill Mathewb, 
Matt SteJzer hod tjielr families 
and Mrs. ;Tom Bryaht and daugh­
ter, Maty.

Pioneer Resident, 79,
Died Friday Evening
Follow ing Long Illness

Mrs. John Luke, Sr., 79, died 
at her home north of the city Fri­
day evening at 5:15 following a 
lengthy illness.

Funeral services were held at 
Sacred Heart church Monday 
morning at 9 o’clock with Rev. 
Thomas Buergler, pastor, officiat­
ing at the requiem high mass and 
at burial in the Muenster cemetery 
Four grandsons, Paul andMichael 
Luke and Daniel and Bernard 
Luke served as altar boys, and six 
grandsons were pall bearers: Vin­
cent Luke, Petty Officer 2C, 
Dallas; S. Sgt. Wilmer Luke, Lub­
bock; Edwin Luke. Fort Worth; 
and Arthur, Paul and Urban End­
res, Muenster. Funeral arrange­
ments were under the direction 
of Mrs. Nick Miller.

Mrs. Luke, whose maiden name 
was Mary Koester, was born in 
Wentzville, Missouri, on Novem­
ber 28, 1863, and was married to 
John Luke on April 18, 1882. They 
moved to Muenster to make their 
home in 1902. Mr. and Mrs. Luke, 
as pioneer citizens of the commun­
ity, took active part in both civic 
and religious enterprises. They en­
gaged in farming and he was also 
one of the early school teachers 
here. For 30 years he was organist 
of Sacred Heart parish. They cel­
ebrated their golden wedding an­
niversary in April of 1932 and he 
died the same year on November 
26.

Survivors are ten children, six 
sons and four daughters: John 
Luke of Fort Worth; Carl Luke, 
Dawn; Mrs. Mike Koelzer, Here­
ford; Ben, Henry and Joe Luke, 
Mrs. W.H. Endres and Mrs. Mar- 
bin Friskq, Muenster; Alphonse 
and Miss Theresa Luke, who re­
side at the family home, 42 grand­
children, 9 great-grandchildren, 
and three brothers and a sister, 
who reside in Missouri. Nine of 
Mrs. Luke’s grandsons are serving 
in the U.S. armed forces.

All ten children were here to at­
tend their mother’s bedside and 
remained for the funeral services. 
Other relatives at the last rites 
were Miss Eugenia Luke, Fort 
Worth; Mrs. Carl Luke, Mike Koel­
zer, Mrs. Lloyd Neal, and Miss El- 
freda Luke of Denton.

---------------- V----------------

RATION “ COINS”  T O  
BE USED FOR POINT 
CHANGE M AKIN G

Plastic or glass “coins” valued 
in ration points rather than cents 
will be put into circulation begin­
ning about January 1, OPA has 
announced, as a supplement to the 
present stamp system.

The tokens, red and blue, will 
be manufactured in one and five 
point units, the one-point token 
to be about the size of a nickel 
and the five-point about the size 
of a quarter.

For use only in food rationin'’' 
the tokens will be given to dealers 
to make change for stamps of a 
higher value. Red tokens will be 
used for meat and blue ones for 
processed goods.

War Ration Book 3 will become 
effective about Sept. 12, it was 
stated.

LEAGUE, GARDEN CLUB 
HAS MEETING FRID AY

Mrs. Herbert Meurer and Mrs. 
Tony Gremminger were speakers 
on the program at the regular 
monthly meeting of the Civic Lea­
gue and Garden Club Friday af­
ternoon. Mrs. Meurer’s subject 
was “What to do in the Garden in 
August” and a round table discus­
sion by members followed. Mrs. 
Gremminger told about Colonial 
Gardens in America.

During the business session, pre­
ceding the program, Mrs. M. J. 
Endres, vice president, presided 
and committee chairmen gave re­
ports.

--------------- V--------------
FOUR SISTERS TOGETHER 
FIRST TIME IN 6 YEARS

Mrs. J.J. Haverkamp and Mrs. 
A1 Fleitman returned last Thurs­
day from a week’s visit in Carls­
bad, N.M., where they were guests 
of their sister, Mrs. A.H. Lueb 
and family. Other guests during 
the week were another sister, Sis­
ter Ann Theodore, and the Lueb’s 
daughter. Sister Miriam Dorothy, 
bftth of San Antonio. It was the 
first time that the four sister* 
have ttefen together in si* years.’ 
r Tfcfe M'tienster ladles also fen- 
joyed a ttrnr bf the Carlsbad Cav* 
ernb before returning home.

*
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LOCALNEWS B R I E F S

Short Items of Interest About Folka You Know

Mrs. John Ezell and daughter, 
Patsy, are visiting relatives in 
Kansas.

A new home for the Bill Derich- 
sweiler family is going up on the 
same site as the one recently des­
troyed by fire.

Mrs. Leon Helman returned 
Monday from Fort Worth where 
she visited her sister during the 
weekend.

DR. A . A . DAVEN PORT
CHIROPRACTOR 

OFFICE HOURS 9-12 
And By Appointment 
201 Pyhian Building 

Telephone — 100

1-6

CLEANING &  PRESSING 
SHOE REPAIRING

N ick  M iller
■■■■■■■■■■■■■■nr

Mrs. Edna Fielder has as her 
guests her cousins Misses Peggy 
Ruth and Claudia Evens of Wich­
ita Falls.

Miss Lorene Lutkenhaus is in 
Oklahoma City visiting her sister, 
Mrs. Kenneth Newtown and other 
relatives.

A daughter, Patricia Ann, was 
born to Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
West of Bulcher at the local clin­
ic last Thursday, Aug. 12.

Miss Leona Haverkamp of Fort 
Worth arrived Saturday for a 
week’s visit with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. J.J. Haverkamp.

Misses Harriett; Schoech and 
Eugenia Walter of Fort Worth 
spent Saturday night and Sunday 
here with their parents.

Mrs. Alex Knauf and baby of 
Emporia, Kansas, are here for a 
visit with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Swirczynski.

Mrs. Clara Bryant and daughter 
of Fort Worth were weekend

guests of her father, Joe Burk­
hart, and her sister, Miss Ger­
trude, here.

We Can Still ■J

Have Fine Meals
Regardless of the war, rationing and shortage 

of a few items, with a little planning and foresight, 
and the assistance of an experienced, conscientious 
grocer, we can still eat well.

And don’t forget economy and stretching your 
rationing points. You can accomplish both by buy­
ing only the Highest Quality Foods.

F M A  S T O R E
MUENSTER

Baby Furniture

BUGGIES 

HIGH CHAIRS 

CRIBS

MATTRESSES

l

ROCKERS

CHAIRS

CHESTS

Visit us to make your child comfortable

Tanner Furniture Co., Inc.
— Gainesville—

Miss Elsie Afae Fuhrmann spent 
the weekend and Monday in Dal­
las with friends. Her brother, Wil­
liam, was in Dallas Monday and 
accompanied her home.

The R.O. Lytton family has mo­
ved to Burkburnett and the house 
they vacated is now occupied by 
the F.E. McLeod family. The farm 
house vacated by the McLeods is 
occupied by the Morrison family.

Wm. Heilman left Thursday to 
visit his son, Virgil Heilman and 
family in Chicago, and his broth­
er, John Heilman at Fort Madison 
Iowa. He will be gone about two 
weeks.

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Appel had as 
their guests for the weekend their 
nephew. Pvt. Franklin Durgin of 
Camp Howze. Mr. Appel and his 
nephew are both from Flainview, 
Minn.

Mrs. Ed Eberhart spent Monday 
and Tuesday In Sherman at the 
bedside of her daughter, Mrs. Wm. 
Flusche of Lindsay, who under­
went a major operation at a hos­
pital there on Monday morning.

Mrs. Bill Eberhart of Macon, 
Georgia, arrived Sunday for a two 
weeks’ visit with her husband's 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ed Eber­
hart. Pvt. Eberhart is overseas 
with a paratroop division.

said court and styled Robert L. 
Bouis Plaintiff, vs. Veronica Bouis 
Defendant.

A brief statement of the nature 
of this suit is as follows, to wit:

Suit for divorce alleging that 
plaintiff and defendant were mar­
ried on or about May 24, 1940, 
and that they separated on the 
same date; that they have never 
lived together as husband and 
wife, and hat said marriage rela­
tion still exists.

Wherefore plaintiff pleads the 
three year statute of abandon­
ment and prays the court that the 
defendant be cited to appear and 
answer herein, and that he have 
judgment dissolving said mar­
riage relation, and for such other 
and further relief as he may be 
entitled to either at law or in 
equity, as is more fully shown by 
Plaintiff’s Petition on file in this 
suit.

The officer executing this pro­
cess shall promptly execute the 
same according to law, and make 
due return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my 
hand and Seal of said Court, at 
office in Gainesville, Texas this 
the 4th day of August A.D. 1943.

(SEAL) Attest:
Martin G. Davis Cleric 

District Court, Cooke County, Tex­
as. (37-8-9-40)

Plenty ---

1
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M ake you* 044m cotton 
lack* and lave

I t f  FED ERATED STO RES |
] Wm. G. Morrow, Mgr. Gainesville

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Luke of 
Dawn and Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Koelzer and daughter Mrs. Lloyd 
Neal, of Hereford, returned to 
their homes Monday evening after 
being here during the illness and 
for the funeral of their mother 
and grandmother, Mrs. Mary Luke

Mrs. Sidney Otto and daughter, 
Patsy, are visiting their husband 
and father in Rhode Island. He is 
stationed at Camp Endicott, with 
the Navy Seabees, and expects a 
transfer in the near future.

Miss Dorothy Mae Luke of Dal­
las was here Sunday for a visit 
with her parents and other relat­
ives. She is a nurse at Saint Paul’s 
hospital and could not get off 
Monday to attend her grandmoth­
er’s funeral.

Catholic Daughters of America 
held their regular monthly meet­
ing Friday evening. The gift bed 
spread was won by Rosa Driever 
and Mrs. Joe Luke was named 
hostess for the next social. She will 
entertain In her home on Aug. 26.

Miss Miriam Koesler has return­
ed from a three weeks’ visit with 
her sister and other relatives in 
San Antonio. She also attended 
the Summer School of Catholic 
Action and enjoyed seeing her bro­
ther, Frater Leo of Subiaco, Ark., 
who also attended the session.

Conrad Junior is the name of 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. C.M. Wal- 
terscheid He was bom at the local 
clinic Sunday morning and was 
baptised in the afternoon by Fr. 
Thomas assisted by Miss Mildred 
Walterscheid and C.J. Kaiser as 
sponsors.

John David is the name of the 
new son of Mr. and Mrs. Buddy 
Reiter. He was born at the local 
clinic Monday morning and was 
baptised in the afternoon by Fr. 
Thomas with Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Reiter of Gainesville as sponsors.

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Harrison 
and baby daughter, Patricia, of 
Grand Prairie were guests of his 
parents here last Sunday.
Citation by Publication.

THE STATE OF TEXAS
To Veronica Bouis Defendant, 

Greeting:
You are hereby commanded to 

appear before the Honorable Dis­
trict Court of Cooke County at 
the Court House thereof, in Gain­
esville, Texas, at or before 10 
o’clock A. M. of the first Monday 
next after the expiration of forty- 
two days from the date of the Is­
suance of this citation, same be­
ing the 20th day of September 
A.D. 1943, then and there to  an­
swer Plaintiff’s Petition filed in 
said Court, on the 21st day of 
July A.D. 1943( in this cause, nu­
mbered 13858 on the docket of

High cost and scarcity of wire is 
no problem . . . with PARMAK 
you con triplo your fenco with 
wira on hand. Produca moro 
with lass timo, labor, cost.  
Guaranteed and approved. Im­
mediate delivery. See us today.

George Gehrig 

Hardware

When In 
Gainesville Eat 

at the 
Coffee Pot

Gene and Milton Tutt 
. Props.

1 Block North of State

P L E A S E -
Endorse gas ration coupons with license number 

and state of registration and leave them in your ra­
tion book. We cannot accept loose or un-endorsed 

coupons. It’s OPA orders and of utmost importance. 
W e «sk  your cooperation.

Jimmy's Service Station
GULF GAS —  GULFPRIDE —  GULFLEX

v*

You Can't Look 
YOUR BEST—
Unless Your Clothes 
Look Their Best.

Lone Star 
Cleaners
J. P. GOSLIN, Prop. 

Phone S32 Gainesville

"Q e tS e tfa Q c li

New times —  New NeedsI

This year your fall requirements 
are different. These will take you 
to class— to work— to Red Cross 
meetings— to a few snatched 
moments with your "young man 
on leave” .

They have a full time job wth a variety 
of duties. So whether you are a teen age co-ed, 
or a matron with all her war time responsibilit­
ies, you will prove your smartness and good 
taste if you select your entire wardrobe where 
prices are right every day in the year.

The Ladies Shop
MRS. J. P. GOSLIN 

Gainesville

Our Big Two Week

SALE
Ends August 26th

*

l& G /U fCtinA, 9 *t—

DISHES
PAINTS
WORK CLOTHES 
BICYCLES 
COFFEE MAKERS 
ROOFING 
FLOOR POLISH 
SEAT COVERS 
ELECTRIC FENCES 
MOTOR OIL 
BATTERIES 
BRAKE LINING 
AUTO HORNS 
FAN BELTS 
SPARK PLUGS 
PISTON RINGS 
MUFFLERS 
FUEL PUMPS 
WATER PUMPS

AhA Ma*uf, OtU&ui *1oo> NumetuuU *J* Jdut

Western Auto Assoc. Store
112 E. California Phone 1507

Gainesville
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T h e  M u e n s t e r  E n t e r p r is e
Serving Cooke and Montague Counties - ‘'The Family Paper.”

PUBLISHED EVERT FRIDAY—MUENSTER, COOKE COUNTY, TEXAS

R. N. Fette, Publisher, Now In The Armed Services 
Emmet Fette, Managing Editor 

Rosa Driever, News Editor

Entered as eecond-claas matter December 11, 1080, at the post office 
at Muenster, Texas, under the Act of March I, 1879.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES
In Cooke County.....................81.00
Outside Cooke County .......8 1 .8 0

Any erroneous reflection upon the character, standing or reputation of 
any person, firm or corporation that may appear in the columns of The 
Enterprise will be gladly and fully corrected upon being brought to the 
attention of the publisher.

w w w w w v r » » » » i

It Happened 
5 Years Ago

» » « » » » » » » »
Augdst 19, 1938

R u r a l  Electrification project 
gets approval of Washington of­
ficials; J.W. Hess is superintend­
ent. ------ New hospital proposed
for Cooke County.------Ned Mudge

presents Alaskan color 
Civic League meeting.

film at
----- Miss

Elvera Eberhart is bride of Wil­
liam Flusche of Lindsay. ------ F.
A. Kathman moves to Morton to 
open meat market.------Eton Ede-
len marries Miss Edith Fenley of 
Hood.

------------v------------
Citation by Publication -»

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
To Amelia Burrows Copeland, 

Aud Burrows, Ollie M. Knight and 
husband, Torn Knight, Homer J. 
Burrows, Dessle Burrows Alexan-

School Sp o d a li
With new 4 way hair cut and perma­
nent wave $ 5 . ----- Ringlette $3.75.

CREME OIL 
y i  U  PERMANENT

$7.50OIL
PERMANENT

And you are assured the same quality 
service for which Rhoda Ann is notedMachineless Wave

x $5 up

Rhoda Ann Beauty Shop
i 319 N. Rad Rivar St. GAINESVILLE Phona 1373 W (

COTTON PICKERS SACKS
We have just received a shipment. Get them 

while we have them. 7 1-2 ft. and 9 ft. good quality.

Sisal Kraft
FOR YOU R SILOS

Just received a shipment.
Please see us for your building needs for this 

fall, we have just received several loads of lumber 
for your purpose. Also plenty of GYPLAP.

SEE US FOR YOU R NEEDS

The Old Reliable

Waples Painter Co.
Leo N. Henscheid, Mgr. Muenster

F armors!
With the presefit man­
power shortage, you 
must depend more and 
more on machine power

Be sure you get top performance from your 
tractors, trucks and other farm vehicles.

See U* For Your Needs

Muenster Gasoline
Marathon Oil Wanda Greases

And don’t forget to keep a good supply of FLY- 
BLITZ Cattle Spray on hand at all times.

Muenster’s Refinery, Inc.

der and husband, whose name is ' 
unknown, Mrs. L.B. Ratliff and 
husband, whose name is unknown, 
Herbert Burrows, W.F. Smith, 
Thad L. Klutts, the unknown 
heirs of John Burrows, deceased, 
the unknown heirs of Robert Bur­
rows, deceased, the unknown heirs 
of Henry Burrows, deceased, the 
unknown heirs of Jim Burrows, 
deceased, the unknown heirs of 
George Burrows, deceased, the un­
known heirs of W«W. Burrows, de­
ceased, and all persons claiming 
any title or interest in the 76.2 
acres of land, being Lot No. 95 of 
the subdivision of the Fannin 
County School Land Survey, Ab­
stract No. 1248, in Cooke County, 
Texas under deed heretofore given 
to W.W. Burrows of Cooke Coun­
ty, Texas, as grantee, except the 
west 25.1 acres thereof and all 
persons claiming any interest or 
title in the north 11 1-2 acres of 
Lot No. 96 of said Fannin County 
School Land Survey' under deed 
heretofore given to the heirs of 
W.W. Burrows, deceased, ,of Cooke 
County, Texas, as grantees, De­
fendants, GREETING:

You are hereby commanded to 
appear before the Honorable Dis­
trict Court of Cooke County at 
the Court House thereof, in Gain­
esville, Texas, at or before 10 
o’clock A.M. of the first Monday 
next after the expiration of forty- 
two days from the date of the is­
suance of this citation, same be­
ing the 4th day of October, A.D. 
1943. then and there to answer 
Plaintiffs Petition filed in said 
court, on the 17th day of August, 
1943, in this cause, numbered 
13881 on the docket of said court 
and styled J.S. McCormick et al, 
Plaintiffs, vs. The heirs of John 
Burrows, deceased, et al. Defen­
dants.

A brief statement of the nature 
of this suit is as follows, to-wit:

This is a,suit brought by the 
heirs of Elizabeth Burrow?, de­
ceased, except the heirs of her de­
ceased daughter Julia Burrows 
Jenkins, to establish the title and 
ownership of 62.6 acres of land 
situated in Cooke County, Texas, 
consisting of 51.1 acres, being all 
of Lot No. 95, of 76.2 acres, of the 
subdivision of the Fannin County 
School Land Survey, Abstract No. 
1248, except the west 25.1 acres 
thereof, and the north 11 1-2 acres 
of Lot No. 96 or said Fannin 
County School Land Survey, to 
partition said land and for the 
appointment of a Receiver in con­
nection therewith to sell the same 
less and except the minerals, and 
to also sell an oil and gas lease 
thereon, and to manage, control 
and dispose of the interests in 
said land of the unknown heirs of 
W.W. Burrows, deceased, and the 
defendants cited by publication 
who do not appear, and for the 
removal of the cloud cast upon the 
title to said land by virtue of the 
claim and interest in and to the 
same that is being asserted by the 
defendants W.F. Smith and Thad 
L. Klutts, and for general and 
special relief; and in which it is 
alleged that the defendants Amelia 
Burrows Copeland, the unknown 
heirs or John Burrows, deceased, 
the unknown heirs of Robert Bur­
rows, deceased, the unknown heirs 
of Henry Burrows, deceased, and 
the heirs of George Burrows, de­
ceased, each own an undivided 
l-20th interest in said land, the 
defendant Aud Burrows an un­
divided l-80th interest subject to 
the life estate of the defendant 
J.M. Overton in 1-3 thereof, the 
defendants Ollie M. Knight, Ho­
mer J. Burrows, Dessie Burrows 
Alexander and Mrs. L.B. Ratliff 
and the other heirs of Jim Bur­
rows, deceased, together an un­
divided l-20th interest, and the 
heirs of W.W. Burrows, deceased, 
together an undivided 1-2 interest, 
a part of which is subject to an

MUENSTER
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R e t u r n  M I L K  
BEVERAGE*BEER  
Bott les  Promptly

•* * * ★  * t * * *-

Conserve V ital Mnterrnls
. . .  It's  ,i Patriotic D uty

oil and gas lease covering an un­
divided 361-1440 interest owned 
by the defendant F.E. Case, as is 
more fully shown by Plaintiffs’ 
Petition on file in this suit.

The officer executing this pro­
cess shall promptly execute the 
same according to law, and make 
due return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my hand 
and the Seal of said Court, at of­
fice in Gainesville, Texas this the 
17th day of August, A.D. 1943.

Martin G. Davis Clerk 
District Court, Cooke Co. Texas.

(SEAL) (39-40-41-42)

W ANT ADS

ed house. Lights, water. South of 
Myra in Hood Community. See 
R.N. Felty, Hood. - 38-2p
FOR SALE: Two good suits, ox­
ford and' light gray. Pair No. 8 
shoes like new. (No ration stamp 
needed). Nick Miller, City 39-1.
40,000 Farts for all makes of wash­
ing machines; four day service. 
F.J. Schenk, Muenster. 35-tf

FOR SALE: 3 milk cows. On W. 
E. George place, 1 1-2 miles north- 
*>ast of Hays. C.L. Welch. 39-2.
ROOT BEER, make ft at home. 
We have everything you need. Also 
have Blue Ribbon Malt, bottle 
brushes, Caps, Rubber Tubing, 
and Cappers. City Drug Store, 
Muenster, 39-1.

---------------V---------------
— G E T  IN  T H E  SC R A P -

FOR RENT: Unfurnished house 
a mile east of Muenster on High­
way. See Tony Felderhoff, Muens­
ter. 38-2.

DON’T THROW AWAY your 
old alarm or mantle clocks. We 
repair clocks every day. City Drug 
Store, Muenster. 38-2

FOR SALE; Good 15-30 McCor­
mick Deering tractor. Walter- 
scheid Brothers, Muenster. 38-2

FOR RENT: 5-room unfumish-

DR. R. O. BLAGG
Chiropractor Radionics 

Colontherapy 
X-Ray

Calls Made Day or Night 
414 N. Dixon Phone 544

Excellent Food

Properly Served

C u r t i s
Sandwich Shop

East California . Gainesville

HOME DO L L A R S
ARE OUR OWN Children

We cannot spare the dollars earned in 
this community any more than we could 
do without our young people who were 
bom here.

It would be civic suicide if we were 
always to send away the best of our 
youth. Likewise, home-earned dollars, 
bom of our own hard work, should not be 
sent away needlessly to give strength 
to other communities at the expense of 
our own.

This is a matter for every citizen to 
think about—and to do something about. 
Patronize home merchants. Boost this 
community. Buy and bank at home. 
Keep our dollars here to nourish our 
future prosperity. Let's all do our part.

The Muenster State Bank
“A Good Bank to be With” 

Muenster, Texas
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ependable POWDER
on the Ground Keeps ’Em in the Air!!

HITLER, Tojo and Mussolini 
now know what the people of 

this country have known all the time 
. . .  that an American flyer, reared in 
free, democratic America is worth 
several of their regimented robots. 
ALL THE fast-moving, hard-hitting 
American flyers are not trained and 
equipped in Texas, but a great many 
of them are. The building and equip­
ping of Air Force fields and bases 
called for a degree of efficiency and 
speed which only American- industry, 
grown great and capable under the 
free enterprise system, knows how to 
deliver. And in every operation, de­
pendable electric service was of vital 
importance.
THIS COMPANY now serves nine 
installations used in the Air Force war 
program, . .  nine air fields and train­
ing schools which require as much 
electricity as normally used by an en­
tire city of some 50,000 population. In

every instance, electric service for con­
struction and for operation of these 
fields was ready ahead of demand. In 
a like manner, the Company has met 
fully the requirements of all military 
installations and war industries. . .  
ahead of demand, and without curtail­
ing service for civilian needs.
THIS COMPANY has been able to 
deliver the power when needed and 
where needed because of 31 years of 
planning and building a system and 
an organization in the American Way 
. . .  the free enterprise way. . .  to be 
always teady ahead of demand.
WINNING the war is the big job now 
for all. And to this end our facilities 
and resources are dedicated . . .  to win 
the war as quickly as possible, and to 
do such a thorough job of it as to for­
ever discourage the dictators who seek 
to destroy our freedom. . .  our Ameri­
can Way of Life!

TEXAS POWER & LIGHT ' - <  l
Hear every Tuesday night at 8:30 o’clock "Report to the ’Nation" 

over KRLD, KTRH, HTSA or KWKH
T , - *
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Cpl. John Wless of Camp Maxey 
visited relatives and friends here 
during the weekend.

Miss Margaret Gruber of Sher­
man was the weekend guest of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. P.J. Gruber.

Pvt. Henry Reinart of Camp 
Bowie is here for a 10-day fur­
lough with his mother, Mrs. Nick
Reinart and family.------

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Trubenbach 
and daughter of Muenster were 
Sunday guests of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Gieb.

Regular monthly meeting of the 
Knights of Columbus was held 
last Tuesday evening with Grand 
Knight H.P. Schad presiding. A- 
bout 25 members were in atten­
dance.

Cpl. Joe Fuhrmann, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Wm. Fuhrmann, is 
here on a ten-day furlough. He is 
in the signal corps at Camp Crow­
der.

Lt. O.F. Sandrock and Sgt. La- 
Vern Christianson of Camp Howze 
were Sunday dinner guests in the 
John Bezner home.

Rev. Father Conrad, H.N. Fuhr­
mann, Berthold Fuhrmann, Ar­
nold Fuhrmann, Paul Arendt and 
Mrs. Bruno Zimmerer returned 
last Thursday from Sequin where 
they attended the annual conven­
tion of the Catholic State League. 
Mr. Arendt won a bed spread 
which was awarded at the con­
clave.

R E L A X
Theatre
Muenster, Texas

BIG DOUBLE FEATURE
For PRICE Of ONE 

Sat. Aug. 21

'Raiders O f The 

San Joaguin*
With

Tex RITTER 
Johnny Mac BROWN 

and

"Underground 
Agent1

‘Adventures of Smilin’ Jack’ 
MATINEE 2:30

Sun.-Mon. Aug. 22-23
Bob HOPE —  Bing CROSBY 

Dorothy LAMOUR

Mrs. Wm. Flusche underwent a 
major operation at Sherman Mon­
day morning and is reported rest­
ing as well as can be expected. Her 
husband and her mother from 
Muenster remained at her bed­
side until Tuesday evening. The 
two Flusche children are spending 
the week in Muenster with their 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Eberhart.

BRIDE OF THIS WEEK 
HONORED WITH SHOWER

LINDSAY.— Miss Isabel Schm­
itz, who became the bride of An­
thony Klement, CM 2c, on Thurs­
day was honored with a miscel­
laneous shower Monday evening. 
The courtesy was extended by the 
Young Ladies’ Sodality, with Miss 
Marcella Schmitz in charge of en­
tertainment.

The honoree received an assort- 
men of lovely gifts and refresh­
ments were served to 20 members. 

------------v------------
Enterprise Ads Bring Results!

ALPHONSE KOESLERS ARE 
DINNER HOSTS SATURDAY

Mr. and Mrs. Alphonse Koesler 
entertained in their home Satur­
day evening with a dinner party 
for the following guests:

Mrs. Fred Mosman of Lindsay, 
Mrs. Charles Curran of Dallas, 
Mrs. Bill Laux and children, Lil­
lian and Elaine of San Antonio, 
and the host’s son, Cpl. Tony 
Koesler of Geneda, Miss., who had 
a several hours’ leave between 
planes at Dallas and came here to 
see his family. Cpl. Koesler is a 
bomber crew chief and recently 
recieved his wings.

------------v------------
CARD OF THANKS

We wish to express our heartfelt 
thanks to the many friends and 
neighbors, who by their acts of 
kindness during the illness and 
death of our mother, helped to 
lighten our burden of sorrow. We 
are deeply grateful for the lovely 
flowers and spiritual bouquets. We 
thank you all.

The Hofbauer Children 
•------------v------------

Englargement of the home of 
Mrs. Joe Bayer has been complet­
ed and the place will be occupied 
this week, by the Joe Walterscheid 
family. Mrs. Bayer and family will 
move to the Walterscheid farm. 
This contemplated move was re­
ported several weeks ago but did 
not materialize until this week.

Confetti— \

W ADE-TEX
T H E A T R E S

GAINESVILLE

State FRIDAY
SATU RD AY

(Continued from page 1)
When you get a slug of water

you know someone is adding in­
sult to injury. Out of an old tank 
truck and worthy of nothing bet­
ter than sprinkling a street. Ap­
parently creek water with some 
disinfecting agent. At any rate so 
vile tasting that anyone less fam­
ished would never swallow it. But 
therein lay its sole merit. You 
couldn’t drink too much, as you 
might if the water were deliciously 
pure and cool like another group’s. 
They imbibed freely. On the next 
trip seven men passed out. One 
from our group, six from theirs.

Needless to say, the second run 
was about like the first. Only dif­

ference was the bullets. First they 
could be heard distinctly whizzing 
overhead. Later their sound died 
out as the incessant pounding of 
the guns predominated. Toward 
last we could feel the muzzle blast. 
Strange as it seems, most of the 
fellows negotiated the second trip 
with less trouble than the first. 

It’s a tough grind all right. But

remember, it’s only a sample of 
what the boys are going through 
in the hot zone. Now take time 
out to marvel at the stamina of 
men who go through a similar 
crawling advance and still are 
able to aim a shot or wade into 
close combat. Thousands of the 
boys are doing that. For you and 
me.

Pfc. and Mrs. Albert Steinber- 
ger of Perrin Field were weekend 
guests of their parents, Messrs, 
and Mmes. Tom Carter and Louis 
Steinberger. Mrs. Paul Hunesber- 
ger, who had been visiting 
her sister returned home with 
them and left Sunday night 
for Camp Gruber. Okla., to be at 
the bedside of her husband, S. Sgt. 
Hunsberger, who underwent an 
operation for appendicitis.

Phillip DOORN 
Virginia GILMORE 

In
“ CHETNIKS”

The Fightng Guerrlas

In
U Road To 

Morocco"
MATINEE 2:30

Tues.-Wed. Aug.24-25

"Tarzan Triumphs"
with

Johnny Wiessmuller 
Frances GIFFORD 

Johnny “ Boy”  SHEFFIELD

PREview SAT.-11:30 P. M. and 
SUNDAY -MONDAY- TUESDAY

Rosalind RUSSELL 
Fred MACMURRAY 

In
“ FLIGHT for  FREEDOM’*

PT A 2 A FRID AY *
I  SATU RD AY

“ ROBINHOOD OF
THE RAN GE”
With

Charles STARRET 
Kay HARRIS

W.S. M oore
Lawyer

PRACTICE In All COURTS 
STATE and FEDERAL 

Abstract and land titles a 
Specialty

Northeast Corner Square 
Scott Building

Gainesville, Texas' *

SUNDAY-MONDAY TUESDAY 
Chester MORRIS 
Richard ARLEN 

In
“ AERIAL GUNNER”

RITZ FRI. - SAT. 
“ H OPPY SERVES A  W R IT ”

Hoppylong CASSIDY

Thurs.-Fri. Aug. 26-27 
Gary COOPER 

Teresa WRIGHT 
In

'Pride of the 

Yankees*
ALSu NEWS

SUNDAY-MONDAY TUESDAY
“ M YSTERY OF

M ARIE ROGET”

T F Y A N FRIDAYJ. L i A A D I  SATURDAY
Jimmy LYDON 
Charles SMITH 

In
“ HENRY ALDRICH 

GETS G LAM O R”
SUNDAY-MONDAY TUESDAY 

ABBOT and COSTELLO 
In

“ IT AIN T H A Y ”

Avoid serious physical danger and the danger 
of shortening the life of your car! Have us give your 
car a complete going-over and tighten every loose 
bolt and other parts of your car before the damage 
goes too far! Our experienced service men are ready 
to offer helpful advice on the upkeep of your car!

F. £ .  S ch m itz
GAINESVILLE

Texas Theatre
Saint Jo, Texas

August 21 thru August 27 
Saturday Only

"Shadows on 

the Sage**
The 3 MESQUITEERS

Prevue Saturday Night 
Sunday —  Monday

#Five Graves 

to Cairo*
Franchot TONE 

Akm TAMIROFF 
Ann BAXTER

Tues. —  Wed. —  Thurs.

,Mr. Lucky* '
Cary GRANT 
Lraane DAY

ISABEL SCHMITZ, 
ANTHONY TCLEMENT 
UNITED THURSDAY

LINDSAY.— Miss Isabel Marie 
Schmitz, daughter of Theodore 
Schmitz of Lindsay, and Anthony 
Klement, CM 2c, U.S. Coast 
Guard, of Muenster and Bucksport 
S.C., and son of Mr. and Mrs. Fr. 
Klement of Muenster, were united 
here in St. Peter’s church Thurs­
day morning at 9 o'clock, with the 
pastor, Rev. Conrad Herda, offic­
iating at the rites and at the nu­
ptial high mass.

The bride was lovely in a floor 
length gown of white fashioned 
with a long, fitted bodice of satin i 
and full net skirt, bracelet length’ 
sleeves and sweetheart neckline. 
Her fingertip veil was held ini 
place with a wreath of seed pearls ’ 
and she carried an arm bouquet of 
white gladiolas. For “ something 
borrowed” she wore a strand of 
pearls belonging to her sister-in- 
law, Mrs. Pat Schmitz, of Gaines 
ville.

The maid of honor. Miss Anna 
Marie Klement, sister of the 
groom, wore a gown of pink ribbed 
taffeta, made similar to the bride’s 
with bracelet length sleeves. She 
wore a shoulder-length veil mat­
ching her dress and a corsage of 
white carnations.

Harold Schmitz, brother of the 
bride, was best man.

Breakfast was served to the bri­
dal party following the church 
services and at noon immediate 
members of the two families, Fr. 
Conrad and the Muenster pastors, 
were guests at dinner in the home 
of the bride’s father. The bride’s 
chosen colors were accented in the 
dining room and the table was 
centered with a three-tiered cake, 
topped with miniature bridal figu­
rines, and flanked with pink and 
white tapers.

A reception in the community 
hall, beginning at 8 p.m. with a 
bufet supper and terminating 
with a dance, honored the couple 
in the evening. Approximately 200 
persons attended.

The bridegroom is on a 14-day 
leave and the couple will visit re­
latives here and in Muenster ’til 
Monday when they depart for S. 
Carolina to make their home in 
Bucksport, where he is stationed. 
For traveling the bride will wear 
a navy frock with wmte accessor­
ies.

Both young people are popular 
in Lindsay and Muenster of which 
they are natives and whey they at­
tended school. He entered the ser­
vice on the 25th of August last 
year.

Is Your Car Getting Hot?
Let us Reverse Flush the radiator and Engine 

to remove rust and dirt. Let us help you care for your 
car for your country.

Herr Motor Co..
Muenster

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to take this means to 

express to our friends our sincer- 
est thanks for their kindness to us 
following the loss of our home by 
fire. We are grateful for the show­
er given by the Mision Circle and 
every other act of help and for 
the many items presented to us.

Bill Derichsweiler Family.

Friday Only

' Johnny Doughboy*
Jane WITHERS 

Henry WILCOXON

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to thank our friends 

and neighbors for the many acts 
of kindness extended to us during 
the illness and death of our dear 
mother. We appreciate each help­
ful deed, the many expressions 
of sympathy, the lovely flowers 
and the spiritual bouquets.

The Luke Children.
----------------- V-----------------

—  Bom b the Japs W ith  Junk ! —

ATTENTION FARMERS!
Now W e Hr/e It

Disk Grinder
GRIND ’EM —  M AKE ’EM LIKE NEW

SAVE FUEL and POWER 
You wouldn’t think of cutting meat with a dull 

knife so why plow with dull disks?
Look at this new machine and bring in those 

disks for sharpening.

A1 Walterscheid
ti

Machine Shop
Mufe'nster

POINTS• • • • •

MONEY
• • • • •

TIM E .
# '  • 
m"

BY SHOPPING HERE
%

Seeing is believing — and we are ready to show 
you. Quality Foods —  Economically Priced.

See Us For School Supplies

Hoelker Grocery
LINDSAY, TEXAS

The Best Fish Are 
Not Always Near

The DAM
So it is with used cars. Look at these Cars and at

j the Price. You’ll SAVE MONEY.
»

! | 1936 Chevrolet 2-door Sedan......................... $195.00
! 1936 Ford 2-door Sedan...................................  295.00
j 1941 PlymouthDeluxe Tudor
i New Tires and Heater......................  985.00
! 1942 Plymouth Deluxe 4-dr., Like n ew ........ 1295.00

3en Seyler Motor Company
i hone 75

ie e e a e a e e e i

See Id A fyosi

PYREX WARE
WINDOW SHADES 

PAINT BRUSHES

WALLPAPER 
CANVASS 

FLOOR WAX

Glass Coffee Makers

POCKET KNIVES 
BUTCHER KNIVES 

GARBAGE CANS

CEDAR BUCKETS 
FLOOR MOPS 

SPRAY PUMPS

Glass Washboards

MOUND CITY 
Paints and Varnishes

C, D. Shamburger Lumber Co*»
Jerome Fagel, Mgr. Muenster

f i Yt YY.YM-


