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Claborns Meet For 24th 	H.M. (Henry) Carter 
Reunion At Mountain View 	Celebrates 90th Birthday 

Families took advantage if 
the Labor Day holiday and 
took that one last trip or fount 
to the lake before becoming 
totally absorbed in the fall 
school semester and all its 
activities. 

Wildcats Lose 
Opener With 

Early 
Longhorns 7-6 

Caner was the County Road 
Commissioner in Rising Star 
from 1947 to 1957. 
Mr. Carter was married to 

Onie Palmer, December 24, 
1913. They were the parents 
of one son. Lynn Carter. Mr. 
Carter also has two 
grandchildren Barbara Nell 
Hile of Lake County 
California and Ronald Carter 
of Jacksonville, Floridia. 
Mr. Carter enjoys fishing, 

visiting with folks and just 
living from one day to the 
next. 
Those 	helping 	him 

celebrate his 90th birthday 
were: Lynn and Jesse Carter, 
Fox and Ruth Middleton, 
Lucille Furr of Eastland, 
Pauline Reed of Brownwood, 
Benny and Alvis Kinnard 
and Guy McDonald of R.S. 

The descendants of Mr. and 
Mrs. W.T. Claborn had the 
24th reunion at Mountain 
View, Lake Brownwood on 

Sept. 2-5. 
Church services were 

observed on Sunday morning 
with Jackie Claborn bringing 
message from Matthew 
16:13-28 and Acts 2:14-47. 
The Lord's Supper was 
administered by C.D. A.M. 
and C.E. Claborn. Jamie 
Claborn led the song 
service. 
Those who registered 

during the two day period 
were Mr. and Mrs. C.D. 
Claborn, Lufkin; Mr. and 
Mrs. 	C.E. 	Claborn, 
Livingston; Mr. and Mrs. 
J.B. Claborn, Kilgore; Mr. 
and Mrs. A.M. Claborn, 
Mineral Wells; Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Claborn, Eastland; Mr. 
and Mrs.Homer Claborn, 

The Rising Star Junior High 
kittens take on Cross Plains 
in their opeing game of the 
season. Thursda• night 
September 8th at 7:00 p.m. 
in Cross Plains. Come back 
the kittens! 

While some of us enjoyed 
the leisure pace of the 
holidays weekend, others 
diligently took part in the 
Jerry Lewis Labor Day 
Muscular 	dystrophy 
Tele-Thon. A total of $942.00 
was raised locally by Dena 
Willett, Shelly Gray, Kathy 
Woody, Teresa Underwood, 
Tanna Lewis, Marc Kizer, 
Gretchin Williams and Kyle 
Williams. These kids 
deserved a round of 
appluase. 

Many things have changed 
in the 77 years Mr. H.M. 
(Henry) Carter has lived in 
the Rising Star area. 
Looking back over the years, 
he remembers some good 
and some bad. But insists 
that there is no better place 
to live! 
Mr. Carter celebrated his 

90th birthday Thursday. 
September 1st with family 
and friends at the Star 
Drive-In . Mr. Carter's son, 
Lynn and wife Jesse 
organized the dinner affair. 
The birthday cake was 

baked by Mrs. Ruth 
Middleton. 
Mr. Carter was born in 

Magnolia 	Arkansas and 
moved to Texas at an early 
age. He lived in the 
Longbr a nch 	community 
where he was a farmer. Mr. 

Mr. and Mrs. Danny 
Claborn-Lesha and Tommy 
Cisco; Mr. and Mrs. Jackie 
Claborn-Jamie and Jerry, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jackie Rhodes, 
San Antonio; Mrs. Clyde 
(Austice) Claborn, Odessa, 
Mrs. D.A. Cochran, Hobbs, 
New Mexico; Mr. and Mrs. 
George 	Johnston, 
Monahans; Mr. and Mrs. 
Merle Claborn, Mullin; Mr. 
J.C. Claborn, Cross Plains; 
Dr. and Mrs. Jim 
Jr. III. Monroe. La.; Mr. and 
Mrs. Charlie Freeman, 
Denton; Mr. and Mrs. Alton 
Claborn. Mr. and Mrs. C.A. 
Claborn. Mr. and Mrs. 
Herman Claborn. Mr. and 
Mrs. Mutt Carroll, Mr. and 
Mrs. 	• 
Gene Hill, Mr. and Mrs. 
Weldon Hill-Pam, Lauri, 
Steve, Kelly, and Mr. and 
Mrs. E.T. Hudnall of Rising 
Star. 

H.M. (HENRY) CARTER 
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The Rising Star Wildcats 
fell to the Early Longhorns 
Friday night in their first 
game of the season. 
Sidney Bell, halfback for the 

Longhorns scored in the first 
period on a run around right 
end for 39 yards and the 
score. Bryan Shaw kicked for 
the extra point. 
The Rising Star score came 

in the 4th quarter when 
Lamar Gregg recoverd an 
Early fumbled pitchout in the 
end zone. The score came 
with 4 minutes left. The 
extra point was missed. 
Johnny Childress led 

Wildcat footimen with 34 
yards in 14 trips and 
team-mate Nicky Newbury 
completed 2 of 10 passes for 
15 yards. 
The game was dominated 

by a pair of rugged defenses. 
Rising Star collected six 

firstdowns and 87 yards and 
Early had 8 first downs and 
113 yards. 
Defensive standout for the 

Wildcats were: Kevin 
Leonard. Randy Bibb, and 
Nicky Newbury. 
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Rising Star 	 Early 
6 	first downs 	8 
72 	rushing yardage 	101 
15 	passing yardage 	12 
2 of 10 passes completed 2 of 
11 
0 	intercepted by 	1 
7 for 27 punts average 4 for 39 
9 for 81 penalties, yards 3 for 
35 
9 for 81 penalties, yards 3 for 

35 
0 	fumbles lost 

The Cats lost their opener to 
the Early Longhorns in a 
close 7-6 meet. The Wildcats 
play Tolar September 9th at 8 
p.m. in Tolar. Be sure and 
support the Wilcats! 

You probably noticed last 
week that a building has 
been moved in on the lots 
recently cleared next to the 
red light. It is reported that 
this site will house a 
convenience type food store. 
The building came from 
Cisco and is to be bricked in 
the future. 

MR. CARTER'S SON, LYNN 
AND WIFE, JESSE 

Eastern Star 
Meets 

Monday Night 
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THOSE WHO HELPED MR. 
CARTER CELEBRATE. First United Methodist 

Church Helps Telethon 
Over The Top 

Grisham Reunion Held 

At Lake Brownwood 
Trail Blazer's To 

Convine Saturday 
NOTICE 

The Adult Basic Education 
Classes will begin Monday. 
September 19, 1977. 
Classes will be held in the 

Eastland High School Lunch 
room from 6:00 to 8:30 p.m. 
on Monday and Thursday. 
All books. materials. and 

instructions are free. 
For further information call 

the High School at 629-2646. 

Mrs. Pershing Goss of San 
Just a reminder that the Angelo will recount a few 

Trail Blazers Association 
will convine Saturday 
September 10th at the 
American Legion Hall. Good 
Barbeque- - lots of folks say 
they won't miss it. 

details along with a good 
music program. And then the 
good visiting is about the 
best of all. Tickets at the 
door $2.50. Bring your best 
friend too! 

Crisp, grandsons of Mr. and 
Mrs. Elgie Crisp of Abilene; 
Mr. and Mrs. Elgie Crisp and 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Grisham 
of Rising Star. 

Visitors attending were: 
Paula Wright of Cross 
Plains; Debbie Hickman and 
Randy Carter of Pasadena, 
Texas; Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Hallum of Newark, Texas; 
Mr. and Mrs. James 
Phillips; Mr. and Mrs. Pual 
Green all from Brownwood; 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
White and family of 
Eastland. 

THE RISING STAR 
Rising Star, Texas 76471 

643- 4141 
Second Class Postage 

paid at Rising Star, Texas, 
under Act of Congress in 
March, 1870. Published 
weekly, Thursdays. 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 

Rising Star Chapter 277, 
Order of Eastern Star met 
Sept. 5 in the Masonic Hall. 

Mrs. Lila Jarrett served as 
Worthy Matron, and Dr. 
Kenneth Morrison as Worthy 
Patron. Mr. Jarrett seemed 
in the absence of Opal 
Fleming. 

Announcements 	were 
made concerning Grand 
Chapter meeting to be in El 
Paso, Texas Oct. 23- through 
28. 

Refreshments were served 
by Bertha Mae White and 
Elizabeth Robertson. 

Hostesses 	for 	next 
meeting, Oct. 3, will be Irene 
Crawford and Evelyn Chick. 

Reporter 

Local Kids Work 
For Jerry's Kids 

Left to Right- bottom to top: Gretchen 
Williams, Kathy Woody, Kyle Williams, 
Marc Kizer, Lana Lewis, Shelly Gray, 
Dena Willett, and Theresa Underwood. 
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In Rising Star and ad-
joining counties, $4.00 per 
year: in Texas, $5.00 per 
year; elsewhere in the U.S. 
and foreign countries, $8.00' 
per year. 

I. 14  MMMMM 	 r- 

Rising Star 
High School 

• Homecoming 
October 8th 

EINEIStidl• 

The decendents of the late 

Ed and Maggie Grisham met 
at Sandy Beach (Brownwood 
Lake) for their 9th annual 
reunion over the labor day 
weekend. 

Those present for the 
occasion were: Mr. and Mrs. 
J.W. Grisham of West 
Columbia, Texas; Mr. and 
Mrs. Sammy Holloway and 
children, 	Melody 	and 
Lester; Mr. and Mrs. Jeff 
Holloway:PI rand Mrs. Mitch 
Patrick and children, Tif-
finay and Jason, all of 

:Pasadena, Texas. Mr. and 
'Mrs. Eddie Grisham and 
Roy Don and Joe; Lola 

Hageman all of Eastland; 
Mr. and Mrs. David Adams, 
and son Mike, from Waco, 

texas; Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Winfrey and sons, Mike and 
Bob, and Tony and his son 
Cody; Mrs. Jimmy Wilson 
and children, Brent, Vance 
an .Kimberly all from Cross 
Plains; Joe Wayne and Todd 

C.J.C. Registration 
To Extend Through 

September 15 
the main campus in Cisco, at 
the Clyde Educational 
Center, or at the Community 
College 
Center of Abilene at anytime 
during regular office hours, 
8:00 to 4:00 p.m. and they 
may register at the Coleman 
and Merkel Extension 
Centers by simply going to 
the desired class at its 
regularly- scheduled 
meeting time, Mr. Odom 

'nted out 

Brag Corner 

Registration at Cisco 
Junior College and all of its 
off- campus extension 
locations will extend through 
Thursday, September 15, 
Registrar Olin 0. Odom III, 
has reminded Big Country 
residents. 

Although classes began 
with the opening of the of-
ficial school year on Sep-
tember 1, there will be no 
problem at all in registering 
anytime between now and 
the fifteenth, Odom said. 
Students should, of course, 
register as soo n as is 
practical so that they will 
miss a minimum of class 
time. 

Students may register at 

they had collected 1644.00 
for Jerry and his kids. 

Last but not least our thanks 
to Frank and Kay Gray, 
Winnie 	and 	James 
Armstrong. Travis and 
Wanda Williams, Mike and 
Amanda Tatum, Chu ck and 
Linda George, Glen and 
Lenell Henry, Frank and 
Syliva Jacobs, Eunice Smith, 
Elizabeth Robertson and 
Dorothy Shook, for their 
hours of labor for Jerry and 
his kids. Let us all hope and 
pray that our efforts here in 
Rising Star will help hasten 
the day when Muscular 
Dystrophy the dread crippler 
and killer of youth shall be 
conquered. Thanks again to 
everyone. 

BM and Joyce 
Easley 

Bruce And Sherry 
Hubbard Receive 

Masters From 
Angelo State 

The Rising Star phone 
center was working hard 
Labor Day. The United 
Methodist Church manned 
the center this year and 
raised $942.00 for Jerry and 
his kids. Bill and Joyce 
Easley, Center Coordinators 
said today, "We would like 
to thank all the people in 
Rising Star that helped make 
this year's Telethon the best 
ever.•• 
Our special thanks to the 

following young people; 
Kathy Woody, Gretchin 
Williams, Shelly Gray, 
Teresa Underwood, Mark 
Kizer, Tana Lewis, Kyle 
Williams and Dena Willett. 
Thise young people pounded 
the pavement all day 
Monday. and hearts because 

Several local teens gave 
this year's Labor Day all 
their attention and spent it 
working for Jerry's Kids and 
the Jerry Lewis Telethon. 

Motorists stopping at the 
red light in the center of town 
were approached and asked 
to give as they pleased to 
help Jerry's Kids in their 
fight against muscular 
dystrophy. Telephone 
pledges were received as 
well. 

Youth workers 
representing Rising Star's 
Methodist Church were: 
Dena Willett, Shelly Gray, 
Kathy Woody, Teresa Un-
derwood, Tanna Lewis, 
Mark Kizer, Gretchin 
Williams, 	and 	Kyle 
Williams. 	They 	were 
assisted by Rev. and Mrs. 
Bill Easley. 

All the workers wish to 
thank 	everyone 	who 
donated. The over $900.00 
collected here will dind its 
way to help Jerry's Kids. 

Secretary- Treasure, 
Dena Willett M 

LETTERS TO 
THE EDITOR 

A VERY SPECIAL 
THANKS 

Beth 17 
Billy 13 

Parents: Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
Chambers 
Grandparents: Mr. and Mrs. 
George Neeley 

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce 
Hubbard, formerly of Rising 
Star, now teachers in Three 
Rivers, Texas, received their 
Master of Education and 
Master of Arts in Teaching 

during 	Commencement 
exercises at Angelo State. 
University on August 12, 
1977. 	Attending 	the, 

graduation were their 2 years 
old son Jason, their parents 
Mr. and Mrs. H.D. Welch of 
Abilene. Mrs. Helen Burk 
and Sears Sintel, Mr. and 
Mrs. Thomas Sullivan all of 
San Angelo, Texas. 

sincerely hope this program 
will help many deserving 
students and I deeply 
appreciate the honor that has 
been given Skeet at this 
time.--Thanks to all who 
made this possible. 

Mrs. John D. (Skeet) 
Clark 

and Family 

would like to say thanks to 
the Rising Star for the very 
nice article published about 
Skeet and thanks to Mr. 
Butler for writing the article 
and thanks to the Rising Star 
school board for creating the 
scholarship in Skeets honor. 1 

Parents: Mr. and Mrs. 
Bobby Fortune 
Grandparents: Mr. and Mrs. 
C.B. Branum of Brownwood; 
Garth Fortune of Cross 

Plains and Flora Childers of 
Abilene 
Great•Grandparents: Mrs. 

Blanche Fortune of Cross 
Plains and Mrs. Delta 
Madison of Rising Star. 
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[BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

DIRECTORY  (REAL ESTATE) 

FOR SALE 
Rising Star- - Large 6 

room house: 3 bedroom, 
living room, dining room, 
kitchen and utility. Ideal 
house, plenty of trees. Priced 
to sell. 

Have prospects for small 
acreage, houses, farms and 

ranches. Would appreciate 
your listings. tfc 

- - - 
Louis A. Mayfield 

643- 4073. Broker 

(  FOR SALE  
FOR SALE 

1972 Model Apache 
Camper, will sleep 6. Can be 
seen at trailer park located 
on East Pioneer St. across 
from the cemetery or call 
643- 7711. 34- 4tc 

Lose weight with Dex- A-
Diet II helps curb appetite, 
Gentle Diuretic, effective 
stimulant. 

Palace Drug Store 
643- 3231 

FOR SALE 
18 foot Bee Line Travel 

Trailer, excellent condition. 
Phone 643- 3426. 34- tfc 

"NO JOB TOO SMALL" 
*insurance claim work wel 
Come. 

*Auto paint specialists. 
`*Wrecks rebuilt-dent work. 
*Free estimate. 
Lester Reed Paint and Body 

Shop 
3 1/2 mi. on Hwy 36 E. 

Phone 817-643-4174 

Cen-Tex Real Estate 
Acreage West of 

Gorman. Excellent 
Hunting. 40 to 160 acres at 
$350.00 per acre. Texas 
Veterans loan or will help 
arrange financing with 10 
per cent down. 

100 	acres- - 50 	in 
ccultivation; 	50 	in 
pasture. 30 in acres 
peanut allotment. Hwy 6 
frontage between Carbon 
and Gorman. Access co-
op water. $450 per acre. 

42 acres inside Dublin 
city limits. Good in-
vestment. 

Nice 2 bedroom, carpet, 
paneling with 1 bedroom 
apartment in back, in 
Gorman $15,000. 

Small business with 
living quarters. Inventory 
included at less than 
$13,000. 209 N. Dixie, 
Eastland. 

12 acres with 500 ft. 
highway 6 frontage. 3 
bedroom frame house. 
City water and gas. 
Morton Valley. 

We have additional 
residential and acreage„ 
listings. 

Jerry Mehaffey 
Lylia Mehaffey 
Johnny Watson 

Gorman ...817- 734- 2777 
Carbon ....817- 639- 2367 

( NOTICE ) 

top dollar for 
pasture 1977-78 
Bank references 

B.D. Can 
817-643-4172 

or write 
Route 2 

Rising Star, Tex. 
76471 

29-tic 

CUSTOM HAY 
BALING 

Call: R.L. (Bob) Rust 
643- 3137 

I will lease your land for oil 
or gas! Wanted to buy: shut 
in gas wells or gas 
production. 

John T. Yount 
Box 1703 

San Angelo, Tex. 76902 
915- 949- 1077 

WANTED- 
Representative needed 
for Luzier Cosmetics for 
towns 	in 	Eastland 
County. Large profits. We 
train. 	Call 	Elvina 
Bourland 817- 629- 1124, 
collect. as 

( WANTED ) 

WANTED- House painting 
Interior and exterior Work 
guaranteed. Phone 643- 3426. 
30- tfc 

NOTICE 
For delivery of the Abilene 

Reporter News to your home 
call Ruth Griffin 643- 4082. 
Monthly rates morning and 
Sunday. $3.95. Sunday only 
$2.00. 18- tfc 

HAULING 
Sand, caliche and gravel 

R.D. Creech 
Phone: 643- 3613 

2-tfc 

NOTICE 
Carpet 	cleaning- heavy 

shampoo followed by cold 
water 	rinse, 	extractor 
removes all dirt into barrel. 

Is your carpet flooded? 
Have machine to remove or 
extract water from carpet. 
References in Rising Star. 
Phone D.T. Boyd (915- 356-
2454. 52- tfn 

Sewing Machine Repairs all 
makes and models 90 day 
guarantee on all parts and 
labor. No service charge. 
Price on parts and labor only. 
most repairs done in your 
homes. Call 643-2404 34-1t 

NOTICE 
Gooseneck hauling and 

day work. Light calves for 
sale. Also cattle bought and 
sold. Call Charlie For- 
tenberry. 	725- 6607 
(P ioneer) or 725- 6307. 

NOTICE 
Custom Hay Baling. Phone 

Davis Harris, 643- 7142 or 
Danny White, 643- 3543. 17-
tic 

MD TRADING POST 
311 N. Seaman 
Eastland, Tx. 
Ph. 629- 2885 

WANTED: Homes in need 
of roofing. Install all new 
John Mansville Fiberglass 
shingles. Call collect 817-
451-2270. (6-19 to 7-21) 

FOR RENT--2500 sq. ft. 3 
bedroom and 2 bath, house. 
Living room, dining room, 
den, spacious yard and 
greenhouse. Corner of Hal-
bryan and Pershing in 
Eastland. $260 per month. 
Call 629-2917. t-72 

NOTICE- Will pay instant 
cash for your old autos- -
whole. Call Brownwood Iron 
& Metal, collect for price 
quote. Phone 915- 646- 7058. 
16-tfc 

WANTED- Hay Baling. 
Call: Louis Richardson, 643-
2063. If no answer call 915-
677- 6893. Collect. 24- tfc 

NOTICE 
We will buy anything of 

household items-part or all. 
Also estates and antiques. 
Call: 915-673-1700 or write 
2010 Chestnut, Abilene, 
Texas 79602. 34-4tp 

Reduce excess fluids with 
Fluidcx tablets-Bonus pill 
box in every package $2.39. 
Palace Drug Store 64 3-3 231. 
34- 3tp 

MORGAN'S CABINETSHOP 
Star Route 

Carbon, Texas 
Phone 643- 6517 

CUSTOM BUILT CABINETI 
I 	  

HOME REPAIR 
SER- VICE 

Carpentry- curbing 
fencing- painting 

no charge for estimates 
442- 3136 or 442- 1370 

I buy jurok cars and will 
remove old car bodies. 
629- 1235. t89 

BARTON PLUMBING 
offers dependable service 
at reasonable rates. 

New installation or  
repair work. 

Tom Barton 
Ph. 643- 1283 
Rising Star 

47- tic 	After 5 p.m. 

s 

We have qualified 
buyers for land in this 
area. If y ou are in-
terested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

3434 North 6th St. 
Off ice Phone 673- 2371. 

Alvin Hackfeld 692- 9597 
Venita Raymond 692-

5244 

r- 

1...,  White 	and 
authorized sewing 
machine dealer. Repair 
all kinds, by factory 
trained machanic, DAVIS 
FABRICS. 610 W. 2nd. 
Cisco, pt- tfc 

BULLS 
Register ed 	Polled 

Hereford bulls for sale. 
Henry Fry & Son. 442-
1767 .  

CARD' OF THANKS 
I would like to thank 

everyone for the 'cards, calls 
and visits while I was in the 
Brownwood hospital. They 
were all deeply appreciated. 

Charlie Harrell 
36- ltc 

( FOR SALE ) 

FOR SALE 
8 x 35 1976 Trailer (Park 
Model) used one year, new' 
carpet, throughout, new 
couch which makes Queen-
size bed, built- ins ref. air-
cond. and twin beds, 2 &Lane 
bottles. Phone 643- 3439 after 
5 p.m. 36- 2tc 

For Sale: Pure bred 
Australian Shepard •pops-2 
months old. ready to start on 
cattle. See Earl Epley Slay, 
Tex Phone: 817-842-5204. 
36.1(p 

H.V. O'BRIEN. Publisher 
iMRS, MIKE DONHAM, Editor 

Second Class Postage paid at Rising Star; 
Texas, 

Published Weekly 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: In Rising Star 
and adjoining counties, $4.00 per year; in 
Texas, $5.00 per year; elsewhere in the U.S. 
and foreign countries, $8.00 per year. 
NOTICE: Any erroneous reflection uponi 
the character, standing, or reputation p( 
any person, firm or corporation which mar 
appear in the columns of this newspape;: 
will be gladly corrected upon being broughti 
to the attention of the editor. All ad-
vertising orders are accepted. 

LIFE 
AUTO 
FIRE 
CASUALTY 

BUDDY AARON AND 
JACK C. SHULTS 

SPECIALIZING IN RETIREMENT HR•lO PLANS 
EDUCATIONAL / MORTGAGE / TERM 

CREDIT LIFE INSURANCE 

	

RISING STAR. TEXAS 	 EASTLAND. TEXAS 

	

817 / 643.54 37 	 817 / 629.1704 

Bunn E.r.r 
./ERVICE/  

YOUR KEY to Buy, Sell or Trade Anythinj 
co 	ARE THE CLASSIFIEDS   

( NOTICE ) 
FOR 	SALE- 80 CC 
Yamaha Enduro 
Motorcycle (dirt and 
street) with helmet. ;275 
Perfect condition. Must 
see. Call 629- 2510. t77 

(.0ST & FOUND) 

FOR SALE- 5 Purebred 
Angus bulls, past 18 months 
old. $250 each. C.M. 
Cleveland, Cisco. 

4 41  * •• ****** ••* 
• * 

Mer 	Ellis 
• lThe  isi.  
• 
•  
• * • Optometrist * 
• 
it  308 Citizens Nat'l Bank 

* 41* 
 Brownwood 

dHdingTexas 
 * 

• • GLASSES 	* 

• 
• 

CONTACT LENSES 
Call 646- 8778 

•4:* itor*   II.  write,ii   * *P  *.  0*. Box  *1.41,9:  

FOUND 
Key ring with 2 keys on 

Joyce Street. 
Come by the Rising Star 

office or phone 643- 4141. 
35- 2tp FOR SALE- 1976 Ranchero, 

air conditioned, 32,000 miles. 
$4,100 or best offer. Phone 
643- 4473 after 5 p.m. 32- tic 

FOR SALE 
FOR SALE- 1974 14 x 60 
Superior moble home in good 
condition. Phone 643- 3022 or 
643- 5911. 32- tfc 

Responsible child care. 

by the hour, day or 

week. Call 
643-4174. 28tfc 

SISTER TERESA 
Indian Reader and 

Advisor. Helping in all 
problems. Love, 
marriage, business, past, 
present and future. 
Guaranteed to help you! 
Open seven days a week 
7:00 a.m. to 10:00 p.m. 
Located on Hwy. 80 E. in 
Mineral Wells, Texas, Rt. 
3, Box 16. 	69 

sign 
east 
trai 
the 
spel 
ffszs 

Do you really get a balanced 
diet? Let me tell you about 
Dr. Shaklee's Food Sup-
plements, Try Dr. Shaklee's 
Slim and Trim PLAN. 

We also carry natural food 
supplements, concentrated 
bio- degradable household 
cleaners, natural skin care 
products, toiletries and baby 
products. 

BARBARA JO KANADY 
SHAKLEE DISTRIBUTOR 
Phone 643- 3291 after 6 p.m. 

B&B BACKHOE SERVICE 
Box 671 

Gorman, Texas 
734-2370 

Frank Brinegar 
Backhoe, Dump truck, 
Ditcher. We do oil field 

Roustabout work 

an. 

I will lease your land for 
oil or gas! Wanted to buy: 
shut in gas wells or gas 
production. 

John T. Yount 
Box 1703 

San Angelo, Tex. 76902 
915- 949- 1077 

mpa 
and 
as ( 

Red Gap Western Store 
I.H. 20 Cisco 
Wrangler Levis 
Tony Lama Sanders 
Don Gay Rodeo Equip. 
Panhandle Slim 
Open 9-6 Thurs. tffi 8:30 
Justin Roper 537.50 

REAL ESTATE 
70.5 A. 13'. i A. peanuts, 32A 

coastal, good well, 1/2  
minerals, 	well 	fenced, 
pavement, 8 miles East of 
Rising Star. 

Approximately 1 A, 3 yr. 
old 2 bedroom home. Neat 
kitchen, paneling, good well, 
sub. pump on pavement. 2 
miles of Rising Star. $10,000. 

Listing Appreciated 
Delton Cogburn Realty 

Phone 893- 6666 
Nites 893- 5898 

DeLeon 
41-tfc 

FOR SALE 
Nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath, 

rock and cedar house with 
fireplace 	near 	Lake 
Brownwood. Call Gibson 
Real Estate 915- 646- 9350 
Brownwood, Texas. If you 
have land to sell- Please 
give us a call. 29- tfc 

FOR RENT- Storage room, 
private- rooms, free access 
19.50 to 30.00 a month. You 
keep the key. B.G. Brown 
Construction Co. 820 W. Main 
Eastland. 629- 1769. 

Men's and Boy's 
Insulated Coveralls 

$19.98 
Open Weekdays 8:30 to 
6:00 Sunday 1:00 to 5:00. 

B&H Trading Post 
311 N. Seaman 

t94 
JOBS WANTED- All 
phases remodeling, all 
types of painting, tape 
and bed acustic ceilings, 
call after 5:00 p.m. 653-
2479. t43 

TREE SPRAYING 
Termites, Roaches 

Call B&J 
Exterminating Service; 
Rising Star, 643- 1521 

or Comanche 356- 3625 
28- lOtp 
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Would like to buy 100 to 200 
acres with or without 
improvements in Comanche 
County. Prefer on pavement. 
Cash or terms. Send details 
to Jackson Bibb, 24 06 Vine, 
Brownwood, Texas 76801. 

34-Ste rearnamensennen, 
`MAGNETIC SIGNS 

an 
icso 
q.R 

PLUMBING 
PROBLEMS Call Hut-
chens Plumbing Co. for 
dependable and reliable 
service, reasonable rates. 
Water heaters also sold 
and installed. Licensed 
and Bonded. 

442- 3803 
LEWIS HUTCHENS 

Rt, 2 Box 70 
Cisco, Texas 

(2- 27) 

We have qualified buyers 
for land in this area. If you 
are interested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

For Rent: Available 
September first-3 bedroom 
house, 103 W. Ross, 
absolutely no children or 
pets. References and proof of 
of ample income. Advanced 
rent with rental agreement 
papers to be signed before a 
notary public. See Allene 
Lawson, 308 S. Main Rising 
Star. 35-2tp 
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Enjoy spacious living in this 
5 bdrm. 3 bath home. Lots 
and lots of closets. Complete 
intercom system. Wood-
burning fireplace. Total 
carpeting. 2 heating- cooling 
units. Upstairs patio outside 
M. Br. sits on 2 lots in 
Crestwood, Financing to be 
arranged. Call Citizens 
Reality. 629- 1769. tf 

Jimmy Partin 
Insurance 

And Realty Co. 

95" a Pair 	I % 915-784-5742 1 
it 	Coll Collect 	t 
O'SSAFSSIIVIPMSSAP'AVAP'SIFAIAIIIAPFA ( WANTED ) 

FOR SALE- 31/2  acres of 
land- - good coastal ber-
muda with three bedroom 
home. living room, dining 
room, kitchen and bath; 2 
wells with electric pump. 

- - - 
Two bedroom home- -

kitchen living room com-
bination. Plenty of shade 
trees. Located on quiet 
street, ideal for retired 
couple. 	_ 

Two Bedroom house, 
carpeted, living room, dining 
room, kitchen, one bath, 
garage, plenty of garden 
space, pecan trees, well, 
electric pump, wash room, 
storage house, chicken pens. 
and cyclone fence. Include is 
guest house, 1 bedroom, 
kitchenette, dining room 
combination and bath. 

Five extra lots can be 
bought with barn 24 x 36'. 
This is a real nice place for 
semi-retired couple. 

Have prospective buyers for 
homes, farms and ranches. 
Jenkins Insurance Agency 

Rising Star, Tex. 
Phone 817-'643- 2251 

48- tfc 

R 
Wanted: Someone with 

good credit to take up 
payments on a 1977 Model 
Nelco Sewing machine. 2 
months old. Does button 
holes and fancy stitches by 
turning a dial. Has a 25 year 
guarantee. 	Original 
$524.95 Balance due $327.60 
or small month ly payments. 
Call 643-2404. 35-2tp 

Alvin Hackfeld 692 - 9697 
Venita Raymond 692 -;,5244 

3434 North 6th St. 
Office Phone 673 - 2371 

DON'T LET ANYONE 
TELL YOU THAT YOU 
CAN'T AFFORD YOUR 
OWN HOME 

Let us show you how 
our financing plan can 
help you turn the dream 
of a spacious new all 
brick home into a living 
reality! 
Call K.B. Homes Collect 

817- 442- 3024 
Nights 442- 2070 

**********t********* 
* 	 * 
* * CUSTOM COMBINING * 

* : 	Contact: Alan Key * 
817- 725- t 7243 * 

* 	 * 
* * 4tc 	 * * 	35- 	 *y

:****************** 

5 
J HELP WANTED: Need 

welders and yard hands. 
Call 629- 8062. 177 

Tra week Realty needs 
listings for Cross Plains. 
Baird and Rising Star. 
Phone 725- 7640. 29- tfc 

Will not be responsible for 
any debts made under my 
name. Ira Dennis Wheeler, 
Ri. 2 Box 63, Cisco Tcx. T76 

• 

Deer Lease with Doe Tags 
wanted. Call Collect Dr. 
Floyd Vest 817- 387- 2137 
Denton, Tx. 172 

3 

Desks, chairs, files, safes, 

LOST & FOUND 	1030 Butternut, Abilene. 

 

w 

Save 20- 50 per cent. 
Large selection. 9- 5.30

eekdays. Value City, 

tables, cash and carry. 

t-  tf  
I 

For Sale: 179 Acres south of 
Cisco, good oil and gas 
potential, plenty of water in 
dryest year. 50 acres of 
cultivation, 129 acres of 
pasture, 9 acres of peanut 
allottment, old farm house, 
$450 per acre. Call 
804-966-2929 after 6 p.m. 
Call 817-643-4235 to make 
appointment for showing. 
35-2tp 

CARD ) 
OF THANKS   

WATER TRUCKS 
FOR SALE 

1969 International with 250 Cummins Diesel 
Engine and 13 speed Road Ranger Transmission 
with 1 20 Barrel fruehant tank trailer 

1973 Dodge with 318 Detroit Engine and 160 
Barrel Fruehant tank trailer. 

- - 
Contracts in the Cisco and Rising Star area 

possible with purchase. 
Other business interests force sale. 
Call 214- 893- 7529. 

Lost: Black Angus-Bramhan 
cross weighs app. 1300 has 
short horns, lost in the Blake 
vicinity. Contact M.E. 
Walters 643-5273. R.S. 
36-2tp 

GARAGE SALES 

The Rising Star Jaycee 
Organization meets at 
7:30 Thursday in the 
Jaycee building located 
on main Street. Randy 
Goldston- Pres., Charlie 
Moore- VicePres., 
Morris DeLong Sec. 
treas. 

Sell Shaklee Products 
Natural 	food 	sup- 
plements, concentrated 
bio- degradable 
household 	cleaners, 
natural 	skin 	care 
products, tolietries, baby 
care products. 

Earn 35 to 40 percent on 
retail sales plus bonuses 
of from 3 per cent to 23 
per cent depending on 
purchase volume. Bonus, 
trips and cars also 
avadable. 

For more information 
Call 817- 1045. 

FOR SALE- 3 br home with 
kitchen, dining room, living 
room, and one bath, on 
corner lot with 2 extra large 
lots in addition. Plenty 
garden space, paper shell 
pecans, variety fruits, close 
in town. Near all churches. 

A.J. Jenkins Insurance 
Agency 

ATTENTION CLASS OF 1962 
All class members and former 

members arc reminded of the 
class reunion planned for 
Saturday. October 8, 1977. 

Please send your adaress to: 
Larry G. Harding. Rt. 2. Box 
976. Alvin. Texas. 77511 or call 
Sue Vandiverc 817-643-6451. 

FOR SALE: 3 1/2  HP 
Tecunsch Indian mini 
bike and helmet. $75.80 cc 
Yamaha Enduro 
Motorcycle (dirt and 
street) with helmet. $325. 
Perfect condition. Must 
see. Call 829- 2510. t77 

YARD SALE 
At Sipe Springs Thursday, 

Sept. 8th, Friday, Sept. 9th 
and Sat. Sept. 10th. 

Lots of goodies 
The Prices 	  

rGARAGE SALES] 
L 	  

WANTED: Homes in 
need of roofing. Install all 
new John Mansville 
Fiberglass shingles. Call 
collect 817- 451- 2270. (8- 
19 to 7. 21) 

•  I

s 	Fast, Dependable 
Film Developing 
Palace Drug Store. 
Rising Star, Texas FOR SALE- Two bedroom 

home carpet throughout. 
Corner, 	double lot, Call 
after 5 p.m. 643- 4473 or 643-
3411. 30- tic 

Carport Sale: Thurs. and 
Fri. Sept. 8th and 9th. First 
Baptist Parsonage. 36-1tp 

0.4.Ara-nreenerresseassi  
The Rising Star Homecoming 	1 

1 	 1 
1 ‘ Will Be Saturday, October 8th 1 1

1  
q Rising Star Wildcats Will Play k % 	 % % 	Lometa Hornets At 8:00 p.m. 

In Wildcat Stadium 	I LIIIIVAISSAVIIISISSIVAIIIIISSAISts , 
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EASTLAND - RANGER 
629-2321 647-1436 

EASTLAND COUNTY'S FAMILY STORE 
FEATURING NATIONALLY ADVERTISED BRANDS 

OF MERCHANDISE 

Store Hours - 9 a.m. - 5 p.m. 

established on Tommy 
Cozart's peanut field about 
one mile east of Carbon of 
FM 2526. 

Gordon said many peanut 
growers have fought the 
battle against nugrass and in 
most cases lost. The BASF 
Company recently received 
EPA clearance for their 
chemical, Basagran, in 
peanuts. 

T he field day will start 
at 10:00 a.m. Sep tember 9 
with a brief introduction of 
plot information and will be 
completed following a 
catered barbecue at noon. 

lOtilif Go 

Thursday, September 8, 1977 

$ 
$1,000 
$1,000 
$1,000 
$5,000 
$10,000 

()sauna t 
Preqie 

omit 

6 mo. 
1 yr. 
30 mos. 
4 yrs. 
6 yrs. 

Daily 
Daily 
Daily 
Daily 
Daily 
Daily 

51/4% 
53/4% 
61/2% 
63/4% 
71/2% 
73/4% 

     

  

BANKAmERICARa 

   

IGV/irwir 

  

   

      

Wt. 0.1.101. 

master charge 
THE .1( 	 APL, 

Your 
	

You 
Actual 
	

Will 
Yield 1. 	 Have 

5.390/0 
5.920/0 
6.72`0 
6.98°/0 
7.79% 
8.060/0 

(depends on 
average balance) 

$1,029.16 
$1,067.15 
$1,183.81 
$6,749.08 

$15,919.34 

BINGO 
The Public Is Invited Wed., Sept. 

7, 1977 From 7:30 p.m.---10:00 

p.m. At Saint Rita Parish Hall 

Sponsored By Las Guadalupanas 

Altar Society Of St. Rita 

Bean, And Meat Burritos, 

Sandwiches, Cakes, Pies, Donuts, 

Candy, Gum, Chips, Coffee, And 

Soft Drinks 	Will Be Sold. 

Majestic Theatre 
Eastland 	 429=1220 

Reopens Thursday 
See At 8 p.m. No Passes 

•,4NT/ETH CENTURY RDA Prevents A LUCASRM LTD PRODUCTION 

STAR WARS 
any MARK HAMILL HARRISON FORD CARRIE FISHER 

PETER CUSHING 
Arhi 

ALEC GUINNESS 
Wrrtter, end Directed by 	Procrureri by 	 M . 

GEORGE LUCAS GARY KURTZ JOHN WILLIAMS 
4,r-44,504- PROS BY DE WYE TECHNCOLCAO 

,PG 	Dki 	 ca* 

Peanut growers are in-
vited to attend a nutgrass 
control Field Day and free 
barbecue near Carbon 
Friday, September 9. 

You 1)eposit 
Thi. Lump Simi 
(Ntinimum) 

Many Styles In 

Soft Polyesters 

Perfect Plaids 

Qiana Nylon Shirts 

Solid Color Turtles 

All Sizes 

SHIP'N 

by DeMarquis Gordon 

County Agent  P  eMarquis 
Gordon said an extensive 
nutgrass control demon-
stration using various rates 
and timing of applicaton of 
Basagran 	has 	been 

Round-Up Now Underway 
Abilene (SKI-The 18th 

annual 	Cattlemen's 
Round-Up for Crippled 
Children is now underway. 
Southwest ranchers and 

farmers 	have 	been 
challenged by Chairman C. 
A "Charlie'' Morris to 
donate enough livestock to 
raise 5150,000 through the  

event--with all proceeds 
going to the West Texas 
Rehabilitation Center 
facilities in Abilene, San 
Angelo. and Snyder. 
Entertainer Rex Allen, 

long-time friend of the 
Center and wife Bonnie met 
with a gathering of 300 
person including area 
chairman for CRCC. Rehab 
Board members special 
guests and their wives last 
saturday evening at the 
kickoff event in Abilene. A 
new promotional film about 
the Rehab Center was 
premiered at the kickoff 
dinner. 
all praised the work of the 

Center in his brief to the 
crowd: "IT has been my 
pleasure to see this 
institution grow from 
treating 20 patients to the 
almost 5,000 who will be 
served this year alone. It's 
the purest charity that I know 
anything about. It's people 
taking care of people. It's a 
shrine to humanity more 
than a rehabilitation center." 
The Cattlemen's Round-Up 

for Crippled Children raises 
a major portion of the funds 
required annually to provide, 
without charge, care for 
those handicapped from 
birth, or from accidents and 
strokes, as well as those with 
hearing 	and 	sight 
disabilities. 
Very simply, the Center 

asks cattlemen form all over 
the Southwest to donate 
livestock or cash. The 
livestock will be sold in 
special auctions with the 
money used to run the 
Center. The cattle sale is set 
for September 26, in 
Abilene with additional sales 
for horses and other livestock 
to follow in October. 
Pledges may be made by 

contacting the West Texas 
Rehabilitation Center at 
915-692-1633. WTRC fielf 
representatives Danny Isbell 
and Sonny Dillard will m ake 
arrangements to pick up the 
livestock and haul it to the 
sales. 

•••••111111.4110411111111.041141011 • • • Rising Star 	• 

• •
• 	High School 	

I 
• • • 

• 
:••••••••••••••••••: 

For 
This 
	 Account 	 At This 

Long 
	

Compound, 	Rate 

 

E BLOUSE HEADQUARTERS SHOR 

 

Many New Fall Colors 

To Mix And Match 

Any Wardrobe 

Popular Prices 

$10 To  $20 

YOU CAN DO IT. 
WE CAN HELP 

• • 

• 
Homecoming • 

• October 8th 

Saving money is hard to do. 
And one thing we know for 
sure at Olney Savings is that 

you can do it. We can help. Take 
a look and see. Wheii you save with 
us you'll earn the highest rates 
allowed by law. 

Before Thefts Happen 

... Insure With US! 

Don't suffer a financial loss. Our 
Personal Property Insurance af-
fords the protection you need in 
case of a burglary. See us! 

Jenkins Insurance Agency 
Ph. 817-643-2251 	Rising Star, Texas 

Early withdrawal on savings certificates are subject to reduction to passbook rate plus 
90 days interest penalty. 

EASTLAND 
SAVINGS 

A division of Olney Savings 

RANGER 
SAVINGS 

A division of Olney Savings 
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Have A Nice Day! 
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WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY 

A Member of The Central and South West System 

Stretch your 
energy dollars - 
install an 
energy -efficient 
electric 
heat pump 

A heating system that's more than 200% 

efficient may seem like something out of the 

future. But it isn't. It's yours today, with the 

electric heat pump. Because when correctly 

installed in a properly insulated home, the 

heat pump produces two units of heat for 

each single unit of electricity it uses. The 

heat pump operates by using the future's 

most abundant energy source, solar 

energy. It transfers heat that's always 

present in sun-warmed outside air into your 

home during the winter, And reverses the 

process. pumping heat outdoors during the 
summer. 

If you have plans to buy, build, or remodel, or are looking for a new heating and cooling 
system for your home, call a local FACTORY CERTIFIED heat pump dealer or talk with 
WTU. We will arrange for a WTU heating and cooling specialist to contact you. Learn 
more about the easy-to-install, economical electric heat pump — your most energy-
efficient heating and cooling system buy. 

Remember REDDY Supplies the energy— but only YOU can use it wisely! 

Thursday, 
September 8, 

1977 

West Texas Utilities Aims To Provide 
Reliable Supply Of Electriity 

Marion and Marjorie West, 
Lucy 	Stephens 	of 
Stephenville, Tex and Helen 
Thompson of Ft. Worth Tex. 
were visitiors of Emma West 
and Nancy Mathews. 

ranagrammannoimirtimit 

Twilite Acre News 
Eva Ashworth 	

.I
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Sept. 11 
Frank Gray 
Stephanie Long 
Vernon McBride 

Sept. 12 
Mrs. Jim Pittman 
Alice Griffin 
Carter Jones 

Sept. 13 
Krystal Dawn Wheat 

Sept. 14 
Janet ft iurphy 
Cindy Walker Elliott 
J.W. Bishop 
Regina White 
Billy Nall 

Hull Reunion 
Held Over 
Labor Day 
Weekend 

Syhle Roark was in to see • 
her sister Mabel Smith. 

Jones. 

The Light Touch 
Ethel Barnes had quite a 

bit of company last week. 
Mrs. Ed Witt, Lela Clark and 
Lila White, also Nell Barnes 
and athleen Wheeler of 
Dallas Tex. 

June Moore of Abilene, 
Texas. Jo Bass of Lubbock 
Tex, Bonnie Campbell of 
Abilene, LaVern Lee and Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Millwee and 
children Ed, Margaret and 
Billy Jack visited their 
mother Bet Millwee of the 
weekend. 

Shane Kelton of Odessa, 
Texas. Tom and ha 
Jefferys, Archie Row, B II 
and Pat Kelton also Ted 
Kelton of Lubbock, Texas, 
Elmer Kelton of San Angelo, 
Tex. and Ben and Vern 
Kelton of Stephenville Tex 
were in visiting Buck Kelton 
last week. 

Ora Jane White spent 
Monday night with her 
daughters, Bessie Bowers of 
Brownwood. 

gl 
tS 

 

le 

Albert and Louise Clark, 
Lila and Lela Clark came in to 
see Dolly Clark and Josie 
Hammonds. 

Irene Mayfield, Emma 
Morris, Louis Mayfield. Louis 
Mayfield, Lela Clark, Lila 
White, Mary Harper, Pearl 
Schlaepfer Evelyn Donham 
and Guyle were in to see 
Mrs. Minnie Mayfield. 

Irene Mayfield, Cliff and 
Margaret Smith of Amarillo, 
Texas also Mrs. Lon Smith 
visited Hattie Boatman and 
Alice Guffin. 

Mrs. Henry Cook (sister) 
Mr. and Mrs. Tingley 
Maddux (brother) and 
daughter all of Ft. Worth, 
Tex, Mrs. Ruby Owens of 
Cisco, Tex. Mrs. Vera 
Pittians of Abilene, Nathan 
Foster of Atwell, .Texas and 
Travis Foster of Cross Plains 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Steve 
Foster. 
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ClaraEpley and Cheryl 
Mitchan from Texas city and 
Tresa Waddell from 
Hitchcock dropped in on 
Lorenzo Epley. 

Bill and Oma Button, Larry 
and Bill Nichols Neal and 
Cleone Courtright and Patsy 
Button of Ft. Worth, Texas 
were visitors of Cecil 
Courtright. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Irby of 
New Orleans came by to see 
his father and mother. Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Irby. Bob and 
Ruth have been on an 
extended tour of the North 
West. They visited their son 
Carl Jr. of Portland Oregon, 
and on up in Washington 
State. 

Ellie Elliott, Fredda 
Criswell, Cordia Wolf. Elsie 
Criswell, and Mrs. Bob 
Medford were visitors of 
Susie Seals and Berlie 
Medford. 

June Moore of Abilene was 
in to see her father Newman 

BY CLINT BRAY 
Show us a man who's a 

good loser, and we'll show 
you a man who's playing golf 
with his boss. 

- - - 
Sure, kids know the value 

of a dollar. That's why they 
ask for five. 

- - - 
A bus is a machine that 

runs twice as fast when 
you're after it as when 
you're in it. 

- - - 
An optimist is a person 

who idles the motor in front 
of the house while waiting for 
a teenager. 

- - - 
At 18 we knew all the 

answers- - now even the 
questions confuse us! 

- - - 
If you're confused about 

the styles to wear we have 
the answers at Bray's in 
Eastland and Ranger. 

Mr. and Mrs. T.Van Barnes 
and Mary Clark came in to 
visit his mother, Edna 
Barnes and Mattie Knight. 

Leroy Woody took his 
mother Bessie Smith to the 
Senior Citizen's meeting. 
She enjoyed the music and 
singing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eldon 
Gotcher of Winnie Texas, 
Raymond and Betty Haynes, 
Berna Chick, Paula Morton, 
Debbie Green and Wendy 
and Stacy were visitors of 
Annie Gotcher last week. 

Joe and Nell Flemming of 
Pioneer, LaVern Lee, Pearl 
Schleapfer, Ray Hutchinson 

Sept. 8 
Mrs. Joe White 
lone White 
Elmore Mauldin 
Harold Butler 

Sept. 9 
Mike Rhodes 
John Lee 
Mearlin Jones 
Arley Bibby 

Sept. 10 
Ray Nunnally 
Bessie Lamb 

Descenda ants 	of 	the 
Almond and Rosa Hull 
families met at the Orbie 
Hull Home in Christoval for 
their 32nd Labor day 
weekend reunion. Games, 
Music 	and 	lots 	of 
reminescenting were en-
joyed by the following: Mr. 
and Mrs. Arlie Hull, Kermit 
Tex.; Mr. and Mrs. E.A. Hull 
of Rising Star; Mrs. Orbie 
Hull Fort Worth, Tex.; Mrs. 
Raymond Hull and Sona 
Lester Roy and Bobbie Hull, 
Buckeye Ariz.; Mrs. Walter 
Hull, Wichita Falls, Tex.,; 
Mr. and Mrs. Clinton Hull Sr. 
Big Springs, Tex; Mr. and 
Mrs. Clinton Hull Jr., Big 
Springs; Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Hull, Big Springs; 
Mr. and Mrs. Elton Hull, 
Sterling City, Tex.; Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert L. Hull and son 
Rob.; Midland, Texas. Mr. 
Almond Lee Hull, Oklahoma 
City, Okla.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Hull, Stanton Tex.; Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Bucicholt, 
Houston, Tex.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ted Vautrin, Fort Worth; 
Myrtle Wilson, Fort Worth, 
Tex.; Mark Repman, 
College Station, Tex.; Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Coker and 
Sam Andy. Sugarland, Tex.; 
Mr. and Mrs. James J. 
Coker, Sugarland, Tex.; Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Burnhard and 
son Wes. Odesssa, Texas; 
Visitors were Mrs. Lee 
Burnett, Christoval, Mrs. 
Harry Chapel, Christoval, 
Mr. and Mrs. Doug Mims, 
Cisco, Texas. 

"No one wants another level 
of regulation, but FPC 
jurisdiction is just not that 
onerous." 

Chalker noted that four 
investor- owned 	electric 
utilities in Texas have 
always operated in in-
terstate commerce subject 
to FPC jurisdiction without 
any adverse effects. These 
are Gulf States Utilities Co., 
Southwestern Public Service 
Co., El Paso Electric Co., 
and Southwestern Electric 
Power Co. 

"The facts of life in the 
utility business now are that 
the financing of power 
plants, whether they be 
coal- fired 	or 	nuclear- 
powered, is more than many 
companies can handle 
alone,- - 	Chalker 	said. 
"There must be sharing of 
construction costs and 
subsequent sharing of the 
electric energy produced. 
This calls for strong elec-
trical ties with our sister 
companies." 

The importance of an 
adequate and reliable power 
supply was emphasized in 
July when New York was 
blacked out for an entire 
day. 

"There can be no absolute 
guarantee," Chalker said, 
"But we have taken all 
possible precautions against 
anything in the order of the 
New York blackout hap-
pening down here." 

WTU's current generating 
capacity has a built- in 
reserve of about 26 per cent 
above the peak demand. This 
is well above national 
standards. Other safeguards 
include a transmission 
system designed to eliminate 
too much dependence on any 
one power plant, and oil 
circuit breakers situated at 
strategic points to keep any 
power 	outage 	from 
cascading through the e n-
tire system. 

Because of the company's 
confidence in its present 
system an in its plans for the 
future, WTU is continuing a 
program of assisting com-
munities in their efforts to 
obtain and hold new in-
dustry. 

Through 	its 	Area 
De velopment Department, 
WTU works closely with 
local eimmunities, 
especially through their 
chambers of commerce and 
industrial foundations. 

Gary 	Vest, 	area 
development representative, , 
says much of the work is 
done in response to requests 
from the communities, but 
that WTU initiates some 
efforts to interest new 
businesses in locating in the 
area. 

The WTU area develop-
ment staff, though small, has 
helped a number of towns 
establish their own in-
dustrial foundations and has 
trained sales teams to 
prepare facts and figures 
about their communities to 
present to prespective in-
dustries. About 30 of the 61 
towns in which WTU has 
offices now have industrial 
foundations. 

Vest said he keeps an eye 
out constantly for new 
prospects. WTU works 
closely with the Texas In-
dustrial Commission and the 
West Texas Chamber of 
Commerce. 

Among the things stressed 
when trying to lure a new 
industry to the area are the 
climate, the availability of 
labor, and the availability of 
land, buildings, and energy. 
Energy, of course, is WTU's 
strongest selling point. And 
WTU is taking steps to keep 
it that way by planning for 
alternate forms of boiler fuel 
in the future as petroleum 
supplies dwindle. 

"West Texas Utilities 
couldn't stop growing even if 
it wanted to," Chalker said, 
"because we are dedicated 
to providing an essential 
public service in a growing 
region." 

Recent - 

New 

billion plant. 
Looking further into the 

future, WTU hopes to benefit 
from lignite deposits the four 
CSW companies own in East 
Texas. A rule of economy in 
the Electric utility business, 
Chalker explained is that 
power plants should be built 
as close to the fuel source as 
possible. This is especially 
true of lignite, which is a 
low- grade 	coal 	not 
economical to transport long 
distances. 

"We will be able to 
generate a great deal of 
power over there in East 
Texas where both fuel and 
water 	are 	plentiful," 
Chalker said. 

"But to get our share of 
that lignite we already own, 
and to control the size of our 
reserves for the greatest 
benefit to our customers, we 
must link our four Central 
and South West companies 
as tightly together as 
possible," Chalker ex-
plained. 

In fact, he said, WTU's 
ability to provide its 
customers the most reliable 
and economical service in 
the future hinges largely on 
it's ability to establish strong 
interconnections with the 
other companies. 

To accomplish this, WTU 
must operate across state 
lines, and so far, all attempts 
to do so have been blocked. 
The main obstacle has been 
objections raised by several 
large Texas utility firms 
over WTU establishing in-
terstate connections which 
could place all companies 
tied with WTU under 
jurisdiction of the Federal 
Power Commission. 

After a hearing this past 
spring in Austin, the Public 
Utility Commission of Texas 
ordered WTU to drop con-
nections it had made in 
Oklahoma. WTU complied, 
but filed an appeal 
questioning the PUC's 
authority to order a com-
pany out of interstate 
commerce. 

Referring to state lines as 
"artificial barriers," 
Chalker said that if such 
restraints are allowed to 
continue, the consumers will 
be the losers. 

"We must be able to 
operate in the best interests 
of our customers," he said. 

Planning now being 
carried out by West Texas 
Utilities Co. and its three 
sister companies in the 
Central and South West 
Corp. is aimed at main-
taining a reliable supply of 
electricity in the system's 
three- state service area 
after some other forms of 
energy have become 
unavailable. 

"Our constant goal is to be 
prepared to meet all 
demands for electric energy 
and to handle any type of 
emergency," said Durwood 
Chalker, WTU president. 

Two factors d- ominate 
current planning, Chalker 
said. 

One is the fuel crisis, 
which is forcing many 
electric utilitie' to turn to 
new sources of fuel for power 
generation. The other is the 
impressive population and 
economic growth of the WTU 
territory. 

Facing up to the fuel 
situation, the Central and 
South West Companies have 
launched a five- year $2.7 
billion construction program 
which will substantially 
reduce 	the 	system's 
dependence on natural gas 
and oil for boiler fuel. 

The system- s first coal 
plant was placed on line this 
past spring in East Texas. It 
was built and is being 
operated by Southwestern 
Electric Power Co. of 
Shreveport. Another of the 
operating companies, 
Central Power and Light of 
Corpus Christi, is a partner 
in a nuclear project under 
construction in South Texas. 

West Texas Utilities Co.- s 
first departure from gas and 
oil as boiler fuel will be 
coal- fired generation from 
two units now being built 
near Tulsa by Public Service 
Co. of Oklahoma. The units 
are to be jointly owned by 
PSO and WTU. 

And within a decade, WTU 
hopes to complete a huge 
new coal- fired generating 
station on the edge of its own 
territory in Lake Kemp-
Lake D IVERSION AREA 
NEAR Vernon. WTU con-
tracted for water rights from 
the lakes this past winter, 
and possible plant sites are 
now being considered. The 
CSW companies will share in 
the cost of building this $1 
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Like any first rate outfit. the United States Navy is only as strong as the 
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WHAT A WORK SAVING PAIR! 

WASHER 	DRYER 
MODEL LDA ISTOO 
• 2 washing & spinning sends 
• 4 cycles: NORMAL, KNIT, PERMT. 

PRESS AND GENTLE 
• 4 wash/rinse tamps 
• 3 load-size water saving selector 
- easy to clean filter 
' hoary-duty 'I. hp. motor 
▪ cool-down oars for P.rmt. 

Press fabrics 
▪ Poroolain-enameled top and 

lid 
SUPIGILATOR agitator 

• available In d 00000 tor colors. 
Lao-Pak Laundry Information 
Center 

MODEL EDE 5700 
• special pool-down oars for 

Perrot. Press and knit fabrios 
• 3 frying temperatures 

solootions 
• TIIIISLE PRESS control 
▪ extra-large lint screen 
• large 6.9 ow. ft. drying drum 
• Pusb-te-start button 
• Auteanatio door shut off 
• lob-Pak Laundry Information 

Center 

Limited quantities 8 colors 
Limited quantities & colors 

jr2s,k $1.7400,  

$264°° 

ONE GROUP 

> BOY'S BLUE JEANS 
Regulars & Slims 

Rugged long lasting jeans in 

Polyester and Cotton for easy 

no-iron care. Just wash and wear! 

Sizes 2 to 7 
Reg. $8.50 	  

Sizes 8 to 14 
Reg. $10.50 	 

$6.88 

$8.88 

Thursday, September 8, 1977 Veterans Land Bd. to John 
NI. Kidd Deed. 

cooly  mus  The following proceedings 
were had in the Court of Civil 
Appeals for the Eleventh 
Supreme Judicial District of 
Texas: 

and 

Pecan Spraying Time 

and 

plications of Sevin, an ap-
plication rate of 2 to 3 pounds 
of 80 percent Sevin on 3 to 4 
pounds of 50 percent Sevin 
per 100 gallons of spray may 
be needed to effecely control 
pecan weevil infestations. 
There should be an interval 
of 5 to 12 days between ap-
plications. When using any 
pesticide, read and follow 
the directions. 

and 

Jim B. Curry and others to 
Citizens Natl. Bk, Abilene-
Deed of Trust. 

David Fay Claitor and 
others to Paul Pendley-
OGL. 

City of Cisco to Wm. B. 
Wright, Jr.- R- W Esmt. 

Frank Cacopardo to Roy 
Douglas Bevoni- Asgn. OGL. 

Dallas Fed. Say. and Ln. to 
Leland Hallmark and wife-
Rel Deed of Trust. 

S.A. Davis, Jr. to Tran- 

Leola M. Mathis and othrs 
to Robert Butler- Warranty 
Deed. 

Marvin E Shankle and wife 
to 1st Natl. Bk, Cisco- Deed 
of Trust. 

Tom B. Stark and others to 
0.T. Killion and wife-
Warranty Deed. 

Gaines Shults and others to 
D&P Production Co.- OGL. 

Southern Say. & 
In. To Charles R. Harrell and 
wife- Rel. Deed of Trust. 

Allie Joe Strickland to 
Alva Neoma ingram- Deed. 

Johnny D. Sides to Olney 
Say. Assn- Deed of Trust. 

M.L. Terrell and others to 
The Public- Affid. 

Lowell Thomas and wife to 
Gene Johnson and wife- B-
S. 

Art 
Association 

News 

withdraw the transcirpt and 
statement of facts. Bexar 

Jack N. White v. Grain 
Handling Corp. Appellee's 
motion to dismiss the appeal. 
Deaf Smith 

Texas General Indemnity 
Company v. E.V. Lee. Ap-
pellant- s motion to extend 
time for filing the statement 
of facts. Nolan. 

Dorothy Driskill v. Gene 
Forbes et al. Appellant's 
motion to extend time for 
filing the statement of facts. 
Erath 
Motions Overruled 

Paula Suzanne Hill et al. v. 
Forrest & Cotton Inc. ,et al. 
Appellant's motion for 
rehearing. 	(Dissenting 
Opionin by Judge McCloud) 
Tom Green. 

Mary Sue Hargrove v. 
Universal Fidelity Life 

Insurance Company, et al. 
Appellant's motion for ex-
tension of time fo file 
stranscript and statement of 
facts. Throckmorton. 

The Eastland County Art 
Association began the first 
meeting of their new year, 
with a full house of 43 
attendance, Thursday, Sep-
tember I at the Texas 
Electric Reddy Room. De-
monstrating artist, for the 
evening was Leonard Davis 
of Abilene. 

With a special emphasis 
on colors. (Basically earth 
colors and tones) Mr. Davis 
painted a beautiful landscape 
show scene in oils, of an old 
barn. 

Towns throughout the area 
were represented with an 
outstanding number from 
Rising Star. Dean Warren. 
art instructor from Cisco 
Junior College was a special 
guest to the evening. 

Patients in the E.L. Gra 
ham Memorial Hospital di, 

listed as follows: 
Jewel Leach 
Willena S.  
Elva West 
Mary Boase 
Clara Capers 
Elvin Norvell 
Opal Blackstock 
Frances Wallace 
BLatrice Evans 
Robert Slaughter 
Ruby Hoover 
loco Escobcdo 
Melissa Hainsuil 
Standlec McCracken 

drive 

the pecan weevil's 2 to 3 year 
live cycle is spent as a larva 
in the soil. Larvae that enter 
to soil this fall will emerge in 
AAugust of 1979 with the 
exception of about 10 percent 
of these larvae which will 
emerge as adults during the 
fall of 1980. 

Early maturing varieties 
are 	unusually 	more 
susceptible to weevil attack. 
Feeding of adult weevils 
cause the nuts in the water 
stage to drop_ Chemical 
control during the water 
stage may be r3quired to 
protect the fruit on the tree. 
After the kernel begins to 
reach the vdough stage, the 
nut is susceptible to egg 
laying. A single female may 
deposit up to 60 eggs over a 
month period. Adult weevil 
populations will vary greatly 
from year to tyear but in 
heavily infested orchards 
pecan weevil kpopulation 
will probably be present in 
most years. 

Insecticide applications 
should be applied to pecans 
as the pecans reach the 
dough stage. This can be 
determined by cutting 
through a developing pecan 
kernel. It will contain water 
or gel or dough depending on 
its stage of maturity. 

Nut protection can be 
achieved with several ap- 

Adult 	pecan 	weevil 
emergence has been ob-
served through out Eastland 
County reports DeMarquis 
Gordon, County Extension 
Agent. That means it's time 
to spray for the control of the 
weevil, one of the most 
damaging pests of peccans. 

Gordon said last year 
many pecan growers lost a 
large portion of their pecans 
because of weevil damage. 

Chemical control will 
reduce adult weevil numbers 
before feeding and egg 
laying occurs. Once the 
pecan has been punctured or 
eggs have been deposited, 
the nut is destroyed. Proper 
timing of insecticide ap-
plications and retreatment 
schedules are important in 
achieving protection of the 
pecans. 

Gordon said about this 
time each year pecan weevil 
adults emerge from the soil 
and move into pecan trees to 
mate and deposit their eggs. 
After an egg has been 
deposited, the larva will 
develop inside the pecan, cut 
a hole in the shell about 1.8 
inch in diameter and emerge 
from the pecan as a fully 
grown larva from late Oc-
tober to December. The little 
white grubs with red heads 
or larvae will tunnel into the 
soil 4 to 12 inches. Much of 

James Thaxton to Tran-
sierra Exp.o. Corp- OGL. 

Fannie Tomes and others 
to Walsh & Trant Pet. Corp. 
OGL. 

Tommy H. Toland and 
wife to Walsh and Trant Pet. 
Corp- OGL. 

Hugh D. Toland and wife to 
Walsh and Trant Pet. Corp-
OGL. 

Fannie Tomes and othrs to 
Clyde Houston- Rental Div. 
Order. 

Jesse A. Templmon To 
Clyde Houston- Rental Div. 
Order. 

John E. Tyson and wife to 
Robert L. Hurst and wife-
Warranty Deed. 

Kathy Taylor 	to D.A. 
Keener- Warranty Deed. 

United Aluminum, Inc. to 
:finance America Credit 
Corp- Asgn. MML. 

Rozelle Pippen Ussery to 
Pinto Petro. Corp- OGL. 

Appeal Dismissed 
Jack N. White v. Grain 

Handling Corp. (Opinion by 
Judge Brown) Deaf Smith 
Reformed and Affirmed 

Joyce Winnette Kemp et al 
v. Horace 0. Hughes et al. 
(Opinion by Judge Walter) 
Scurry 
Motions Submitted 	' 

Joseph C. Bond v. Geneva 
Bond. Appellee's motion to 
withdraw the transcript and 
statement of facts. Bexar 

Paula Suzanne Hill et al v. 
Forrest & Cotton, Inc., et al. 
Appellants' motion for 
rehearing. Tom Green 

Jack N White v. Grain 
Handling Corp. Ap-
pellee's motion to dismiss 
the appeal. Deaf Smith. 

Mary Sue Hargrove v. 
Universal Fidelity Life 
Insurance Company, et al. 
Appellant's motion for ex-
tension of time to file 
transcirpt an statement of 
facts. Throckmorton. 

Texas General Indemnity 
Company v. E.V. Lee. 

Appellant's motion ‘o 
extend time for filing the 

statement of facts. Nolan. 
Dorothy Driskill v. Gene 

Forbes et al. Appellant's 
motion to extend time for 
filing the statement of facts. 
Erath. 
Motions Granted 

Joseph C. Bond v. Geneva 
Bond. Appellee's motion to 
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scerra Explorations- OGL. 
Paul R. Davis to Tran- 

scerra 	Exploration- OGL. 
Thomas E. Davis and wife 

to Transcerra Exploration-
OGL. 

Clyde Y. Douglas and wife 
to Marvin E. Shankle and 
wifeWarranty Deed. 

Hazel M. Dempsey to 
Tra- C Oil and Gas- OGL. 

J.C. Dyer Jr. and wife to 
Enserch Corp. R- W Esmt. 

Dallas Fed. Say. and Ln. 
Assn. to Eddie W. Barnes 
and wife- Rel Deecs of trust. 

Mrs. Jessie Ellis and 
others to Bill Pancake and 
others- OGL. 

Elmer 
Escrobedo and wife to John 
Loveless 	and 	wife- 
Agreement. 

Eastland Natl. Bank to 
Doyle E. Squires and wife-
Rel Deed of Trusti 

First State Bank, Ranger 
to Luther R. Gohike and 
wife- Rel. MML. 

Fed. Ld Bk, Houston to 
Sam C. Ca they and wife- Rel 
D- T. 

Zeeha Mae Frost and 
others to Clyde Houston-
Rental Div. order. 

Florence Forges to Hailey 
Oil Co.- OGL. 

1st Natl. Bk, Cisco to Clyde 
Y. Douglas and wife- Rel. 
D- T. 

James V. Fields and wife 
to Geo. Simmons and wife-
Warranty Deed. 

Mildred R. Flint to John 
Loveless Rel. D- T. & V- L. 

Otis Guy to The Public-
Cert. no. Inheritance Tax. 

Billy E. Guess and wife to 
FINANCE America Cred. 
Corp. MML and Asgn. 

Joe T. Gray, Receiver to 
Southeastern 	Resource 
Corp.OGL. 

Winnie Hennington to 
Ward Homes, Inc. Warranty 
Deed. 

Robert D. Hitt to Tom B. 
Stark and others- Warranty 
Deed. 

Blanche Horn to Stephen 
D. Pitts OGB. 

W.J. Hudson and wife to 
Lillie L. Harris- Warranty 
Deed. 

W.R. (Billy) Huestis to 
Pinto Petro. Co.- OGL. 

Dewey Hames and wife to 
Gary L. Hames and wife-
Warranty Deed. 

Ophelia R. Hughes to 
Clyde Houston- Rental Div. 
order. 

Estate of Wrn. Thomas 
Hittson, Jr. to The Public-
Certified Copy Probate. 

Robert L. Hurst and wife 
to Lomas and Nettleton Deed 
of Trust. 

Stephen D. Hudson to Kitty 
M. 	Hudson- Quit Claim 
Deed. 

C.B. Hazel to C.B. Hazel, 
Inc. Asgn. OGL. 

Benny Hagan to Roden),  
Lynn Hagan and others M-
D 

Murray vs. 
Murray- 

Marriage Licenses 
Derryl Waynbe Boyd 

Katherine Joan White. 
Daniel Gene Keith 

Betty Fay Barnett 
Robert Joel Foster 

Cynthia Lynn Butler. 
New Vehicle Registrations 
Search Drilling Co.- Ford 

Pu.- Cisco. 
Linda Wells- Chev. Flat-

Ranger. 
Geo. H. Bridges- Celtic 

HT- Carbon. 
G.W. Couger- Ford Pu-

Graf ord. 
Mrs. Walter Reimund-

Pont. 4 dr.- Cisco. 
J.T. Berry- 

Ford Pu- Eastland. 
Mike Collins- First Cabin 

HT- Grandview. 
Union Oil of Calif.- Chev. 

Pu.- Eastland. 
Burton L. Phillips- Chev. 

Pu.- Olden. 
.S.G. Clary- Chev.- Pu.-

Cisco. 
G. Michael Presley- VIP 

Boat Trl. Eastland. 
Jenny Payne- Ford 2 dr.-

Eastland. 
Joe Bob Browning- Chev. 

4 dr.- Brownwood. 
Guy McPherson- Chev. 4 

dr.- Dublin. 
David Ervin- Chev. Pu.-

Gorman. 
Muarlen 	Lewis- Chev. 

Sportsvan- Clyde. 
Don Johnson- Chev. 2 dr.-

Coleman. 
G.W. 	Maxfield- Chev, 

Pu.- Gorman. 
Euel H. Westpreland-

Chev. Pu.- Midland. 
Bernard 	Spruill- Chev. 

Pu.- De,eon. 
Alvin D. Novak- Dodge 

Pu.- Eastland. 
Mrs. Mary Stie- Pont. 4 

dr.- Ranger. 
Lisa Norris- Chev. 2 dr.- 

Eastland. 
Debbie Norman- Olds 2 

dr.- Cisco. 
Jesus Elizalda- Chev. 2 

dr.- Cisco. 
Rolando Zarate Jr.- Chev. 

2 dr.- Ranger. 
Bernard Jobe- Chev. Pu. 

Ft. Worth. 
Terry A. Treadwell- Chev. 

Van- Eastland. 
Denna Dobbs- Chev. 2 

dr.- Eastland. 
Roy 	Rogers- Yamaha 

Mtc- Cisco. 
Alan D. Criag- Yamaha 

Mtc- Ranger. 
Tommy J. Baker-

Yamaha Mtc- Ranger. 
Leisure Development-

Chev. Pu.- Eastland. 
91st District Court 

William A. Manning vs. 
Tra- C Oil & Gas Co. Inc.- 
Suit for damages. 

Suzane Lanell Tucker v. 
Thomas Tucker- Divorce. 

F.L. Merrill vs. J.R. 
Morrow- Suit for damages. 

Fay L. Marshall vs. 
Milburn D. Harrison-
Reciprocal Child Support. 

Pamala Kay Sweeney vs. 
Edgar Leonard Sweeney-
Divorce. 

Claudia Lee 
James Otho 
Divorce. 

C.B. Hazel, Inc., a Corp vs. 
Ed Furgason and others- Oil 
and Gas Lease 

The Fi rst State Bank of 
Rising Star vs. Bobby 
Seider- Suit on note. 

Wayne Carlile and others 
vs. Ann Carlile- Suit for 
constructive trust and 
declaratory judgment. 

Instruments Filed in 
County Clerk's Office 

American- Amecable Life 
Ins. Co. to Vernon D. Phillips 
and wife- Rel Deed of Trust. 

J.S. Anderson and others 
to Wal h and Trant Pet. 
Corp.- OGL. 

Abilene Savings Assn to 
Lee Ratner- Rel. Deed of 
Trust. 

Abilene Savings Assn- To 
Horace L. King and wife-
Rel Deed of Trust. 

Eula Arrington to 1st St. 
Bk, Ranger- Deed of Trust. 

Cecil E. Altom to Tom B. 
Stark and others- Asgn. 
Deed of trust. 

B&L Cattle Co. to Kitty NI. 
Hudson and others- Deed of 
Trust. 

Annie Burnett to John 
Ussery- Warranty Deed. 

A.M. Butler and wife to 
Joe Cogdell- OGL. 

Vera L. Brewton to South-
western Bell Tele. Esmt. 

J.W. Brown, dec'd to The 
Public- Certified 	Copy 
Probate will attached. 

Estell Bolding and others 
to Robeert Livingston- OGL. 

Roy Douglas Bevoni- To 
Richard Albert- Asgn OGL. 

Tom L. Broom to Lucille 
Broom- Warranty Deed. 

Roy Eugene Barnhill to 
Johnny D. Sides- Warranty 

' Deed. 
Robert L. Carroll to 1st St. 

Bk, Ranger- Asgn. MML. 
J.C. Coates to The Public-

Affid. 

reg. $459.95 

FULL FLAT & 

reg. $7.95 

PILLOWCASES 
$5.95 pr. 

FULL FITTED 

$4.99 ea. 

$3.69 pr. 

Benny Hagan to Rodney 
Lynn Hagan and othrs-
Warranty Deed. 

N.H. Holliday to R.O. 
Gettelman- Asgn. OGL. 

Hilda Hays to Roy Douglas 
Bevoni- Asgn. OGL. 

B.C. Walsh t 
Howard B. Ingram and 

others to Walsh & Trant Pet. 
Co.- OGL. 

N.K. Jones and wife to 
W.G. Reed- Warranty Deed. 

Gene Johnson and wife to 
Wm. E. Justice- Deed of 
Trust. 

Stephen Alvin Johnson to 
Lawyers Bond and Trust-
Amended OGL. 

W.H. Klmbrough and wife 
to Samuel L. Starnes and 
wife- Deed of Trust. 

Harold Lutz to Transierra 
Explo. Corp- OGL. 

Kennth R. Lyerla and wife 
to Joe McDaniel and wife-
Warranty Deed. 

Charles E. Little and wife 
to Welcome Well Service-
OGL. 

Mary Ethyl Doty Looney 
to Bill Pancake and othrs-
OGL. 

Linda M. Loveless to John 
M. Loveless Power of Atty. 

John N. Loveless and wife 
to Jack Kennedy and wife-
Warranty Deed. 

Martha Jo Morris, dec'd to 
The 	Public- Proof 	of 
Heirship. 

Alleen R. Morris and 
others to Clyde Houston-
Rental Div. order. 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S CURITY DIAPERS 
FIRST QUALITY 

NOW $6.88 a dozen 
18 FRIENDLY LOCATIONS TO SERVE YOU 

Reg. $12.00 Value! Main Street Rising Star 



Pioneer News 

- Mrs. A.C. Heiken 

Not Too Late To Plant Fall Gardens friends from Ft. Worth 
visited in the Beggs home. 
They did some hunting, 
While there. sun? Do you need to contour 

and mulch the garden for 
conservation of soil and 
water?" 

"For help in your planning 
your fall garden, contact our 
office for two brochures, 
Mulches for Your Garden 
and Gardening on the 
Contour," Adams said. 

"You should also contact 

Mrs. 	Ethel 	Brown's 
grandson, wife and two baby 
girls spent five days 
visiting her recently. They 
are from Monroe, La., Local 
visitors were Mrs. Lou 
Griver and Mrs. Velma 
Brown. Visitors from Rising 
Star, were Mrs. Lavonne 
White and Mr. and Mrs. P.L. 
Dean, Mrs. Dean and Mrs. 
Brown went to Brownwood 
on Monday and Tuesday to 
get checkups from Mrs. 
Brown's eye doctor and from 
her medical doctor. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Fore 

visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Roy Blackburn in Cisco a 
week ago Sunday. Visitors 
with Mr. and Mrs. Fore from 
Oklahoma City were Dr. and 
Mrs. Russell Dennis, on 
Wednesday. Mrs. Fore's 
sister Bi Harlow of Marble 
Falls is spending the week 
with the Fores. 

to start a compost heap." 
Adams said. "A two or 
three- inch mulch of com- 
post, 	grass 	clippings, 
sawdust, 	or 	other 
biodegradable 	material 
hleps the soil stay moist, 
makes it more nutritious, 
and keeps the weeds down. It 
also protects th soil from 
beating raindrops and wind 
erosion. 

"If you don't have com-
post, you can spread straw 
or autumn leaves over your 
garden, 	Adams 	said. 
"They're rich in car-
bohydrates but low in ni-
rogen, so you might want to 
add one or two cups of 
nitrogen fertilizer to each 
bushel of straw or leaves 
before spreading. But don't 
let the fertilizer touch the 
plants because they will burn 
if you do." 

backyard. To contour your 
garden, make the rows 
follow the natural lay of the 
land so runoff water doesn't 
trickle downhill carrying 
good soil along with it. This 
means the rows go across the 
slope, rather than up and 
down." 

Experienced gardeners 
give seeds or plants a good 
soaking after planting. Then 
they follow up with frequent 
light sprinklings until the 
seedlings pop out of the 
ground. After this, give them 
at least one inch a week. 
Give them a fighting chance 
against disease by watering 
early enough in the day so 
they're dry before night. 

"One of the best things you 
can do for your garden soil is 

and Mrs. Ben Atwood were 
Mrs. Tina Odom, Mrs. Ressa 
Glover and Mrs. Halsell. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Stretch 

and John of Houston and Mr. 
and Mrs. W.P. Sessums Jr. 
of Lubbock were visitors 
with Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Sessums recently. Mr. and 
mrs. Sessums spent most of 
the y 	in Lubbock, visiting 
Lelatives and friends. Mr. 
Sessums saw his doctor 
while they were there. 

tributions to the progress of 
mankind would take us back 
into history to its beginning. 
That is another story. But 
most people know that labor 
both physical and mental is 
health- giving. (Even much 
better than medicine.) 

St. Bernard said, "He who 
prays and labors both and 
prays lifts his heart to God 
with his hands." Samuel 
Johnson also contributed to 
thinking along this line; He 
said, "Labor, if it were not 
necessary for the existence, 
would be indispensable for 
the happiness of man." 

Mr. and Mrs. T.J. Beggs 
went to Sulphur, Oklahoma 
last week, where they visited 
her mother, Mr. and Mrs. 
R.G. Young and her uncle 
Mr. and Mrs. Campbell. On 
Sunday, Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Smith and son, Mark and 

Thursday, September 8, 1977 

Today is Labor Day, a 
holiday that is given little 
notice when compared to 
Christmas or July 4th,. 
Samuel Gompers gave his 
support which established 
laws to make the first 
Monday in September a 
holiday 	honoring 	the 
laboring man. Oregon was 
the first state to make such a 
law, in 1887. All other states 
have such a law. 

Some moments of thought 
on the importance of labor 
may result in our having 
more appreciation for the 
day. Think of the dignity of 
labor, the origin of labor, 
(Adam and Eve in the 
Graham to 'tend it and to 
care for it.); all that is ac- 
complished by labor, to the 
laborer as well as to 
recipents of its results. 
Citing the many people who 
have made great con- 

0414011.641~wikaisase,......„,1/40,40,1460640•6404.6 .4% 

Those visiting with Mr. 

;************** *******************************4 

your County Agriculture 
Extension office," Adams 
continued. "The extension 
specialists can give you 
information to help you 
decide which vegetables 
wouuld do best, and whether 
to seed or transplant. The 
Agricultural 	Extension 
specialists also have in-
formation about fertilizers, 
pesticides, and suggested 
planting dates for your 
area." 

"Before planting your 
seeds or plants, give some 
thought to the arrangement 
of your rows. Contour far-
ming isn't only for for big 
fields. The principle can help 
save soil and water in your 

Did your winter resolution 
to paint a spring garden 
fizzle out with warm weather 
and a bad case of spring 
fever? No problem. It isn'- t 
too late to plant a fall gar-
den. And, if you'll follow a 
few basic rules of con- 
servation 	and 	soil 
management, you'll be 
rewarded with crisp, fresh 
vegetables from early fall to 
midwinter. 

You can grow a medley of 
vegetables in the fall in-
cluding snap beans, beets, 
cabbage, greens, cucum-
bers, okra, onions, tomatoes, 
and squash- - almost any 
you can grow in the spring. 

"The difference between a 
dismal crop failure and a 
harvest of over- flowing 
baskets 	of 	delicious 
vegetables hinges on the 
decisiions you make at 
plainting time," Charles 
Adams, 	district 	con- 
servationist with the Soil 
Conservation Service at 
Eastland, stated. "Is your 
soil type satisfactory? Does 
th garden space get enough 

M. L. Terrell 
Real Estate 

Highway 80 East 

Phone 629-1725 
HOMES 

629-1769 
* 
a 	 a 
* 	 a 

Two Real Estate 
Courses To Be 
Offered At C.J.C. 

Mrs. Nell Flemings Sister, 
Mrs. Lucy Stephens and her 
daughter, 	Mrs. 	Helen 
Thompson of Ft. Worth 

. visited in the Fleming home 
last weekend. On Sunday 
they visited Mrs. Fleming's 
mother, 	Mrs 	Nancy 
Mathiews in Nursing Home 
in Rising Star. 

- - - 
Visitors in the Norris home 

were Mr. and Mrs. . Hiram 
Foster, Mrs. Elaine Ratliff, 
of Pioneer, and Mrs. Ruby 
McCowan and Naomie of 
Cross Plains, Mr. Ronald 
McCowan of Abilene. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norris had 
lunch with Mrs. Winnie 
Flippin on Friday, where 
they visited with Mrs. 
Wanda Cloud and daughter, 
Judy Barr. (Judy is an ex-
pupil in music of Mrs. 
Norris.) She states that Mr. 
and Mrs. Cloud have pur-
chased a home in Early 
where they will be moving 
soon. 

Eastland 3  3 	 3 
Eastland, Texas 

a 	 3 

CA SErii4ZLET filieS   

* 4 
* 	 -* 
* * 
* * 
-4( 	 * 

a 	 a 

* 4` 820 W. Main 

4t Eastland.. Extra nice, 2 bedrooms, I bath, I car garage home on large wooded lot, in 	* 
3 good neighborhood. Fully carpeted, drapes, 6 ft. wood fenced back yard; Separate 	

* 
a 

3 garden spot, permanent storage building, patio with patio furniture. See to ap- 	* 4E  
* preciate. 

* 
* 	Large 4 bedroom, 2 bath, 2 car guy,.') Par carport on extra large corner lot, central -* a  
* air and heat, range with self- cleaninSOLD Franklin fireplace, fenced garden spot, a *6 ft. wood fence around back yard, ex„..--..iition, 30,000.00 no dn. py. for Veteran, * 
* sm. dn. FHA. 	 , 	 -* 
* 	

LUXURY DUPLEX- Each side has 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 1 car garage, built- ins, central* 

Mrs. Lottie Sooter was 
Hostess for a Pie Supper at 
her home, Sunday night, in 
honor of Mrs. Edna Helms 
who is moving away. Ma ny 
Pioneer and Cross Plains 
people attended this going 
Away Party for a member of 
the East Side Church of 
Christ. 

Danny and Patricia Hutton 
and Bobbie had Sunday 
lunch with Mr. and Mrs. 
Homer Parsons. Mrs. 
Parsons wishes to remind 
readers that there is time yet 
to become a Demonstrator 
for the products she 
represents. The deadline is 
Sept. 17th. 

the first class meeting night 
at 6:30 p.m. 
Mr. Odom, who is a real 

estate instructor as well as 
college registrar, said that 
the 113 class is a basic real 
estate course that is needed 
before one applies for a real 
estate license. He described 
the 173 class as one that 
helps satisfy requirements 
for a broker's license, and 
that also teaches a real estate 
saleperson some of the 
mathematical 	procedures 
utilized in the industry. 
More information may be 

obtained by contacing Mr. 
Odom at Cisco Junior 
College, 	telephone 
817-442-25 6 7. 

Two Real Estate courses 
will be offered at Cisco 
Junior College during the 
current fall semester, 
Registrar Olin 0. Odom Ill 
has announced. 
The classes will be Real 

Estate 113 (Principles and 
Practices of Real Estate) and 
Real Estate 173 (Real Estate 
Math.) The 113 course will 
meet on Monday evenings, 

beginning on September 12, 
from 6:30 to 9:30 p.m. and 
the 173 class will meet on 
Tuesday 	evenings, 
beginning September 13, 
during the same hours. 
Registration will be held at 
the CJC Registrar's office on 

it *air and heat- Live in one side and rent the other or invest for rental income. Tremendous* 
* tax advantage. 	 it 
it 	NICE 2 bedroom, 1 bath hor 	 orner lot, New carpet- New kitchen cabinets- No* 
*Down Payment for Vets. or St SOLD iyment FHA. 	 it 

:. CUSTOM 2 story home on large wooded lot and prestige address. 5 bedroom, 3 baths, 2 car* 41 

*garage. Fully loaded with extras including wood burning fireplace,, built- in desks and-it 
* cabinets, and intercom. A beautiful home. TRADES CONSIDERED. A good buy at'? 

* 
*$65,000.00. 

SPACIOUS 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 2 - -* . 
*finest neighborhood. Central a 

Dr. Guy Newman, 
President Emeritus of 
Howard Payne University in 
Brow nwood will introduce 
John B. Connally at a fund 
raising dinner on behalf of 
Jack Burgess on September 
13 in Waco. Connally, the 
featured speaker at the 
banquet to honor the con-
servative Republican, will 
be addressing a full house at 
Ridgewood Country Club. 

In 1949, Newman joined 
Baylor 	University 	as 
Assistant to President W.R. 
White. He became Vice-
President in 1952, the same 
year he received his Doc-
torate of Theology from 
Southwestern Seminary. 

Dr. Newman left Baylor in 
1955 to become President of 
Howard Payne University 
and served in that capacity 
until 1972 when he received 
his present title. He received 
his B.A. from Baylor in 1941 
after leaving the business 
world to become a Baptist 
pastor. 

Items Of Interest 

In Eastland: 
6 room older type home on corner lot in Eastland. $9,600.00. 
Large 1 bedroom home, with approximately 1 acre, that 

has been remodeled. Located North of Eastland. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath brick home on corner lot. Close to all 

schools. $40,000.00. 
3 bedroom, 1 bath older home that needs repair. $7,500.00. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath brick home on corner lot. Close to all 

schools. $40,000.00. 
New large 2 bedroom, 1 1.2 bath duplex with carpet and 

built- ins. Priced below appraisal value. 
5 bedroom, 3 1/2  bath brick home with carpet, fireplace and 

swimming pool. Real nice. $63,000.00. 
5 bedroom, 11.2  bath home with 2 lots. 
4 bedroom, 2 bath two- story older type home on corner lot. 

$20,000.00. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath home that has been completely 

remodeled, including carpeting. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath brick home. Pay equity and assume 

balance of loan. Total price $29,800.00. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath home with double garage, carpet, en- 

closed heated swimming pool. Nice location. $60,000.00. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath large older type home with 3 lots. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath older home in good location with carpet, 

paneling and large lot. $23,500.00. 
Other locations: 
8 room, 1 bath 

]der home in Carbon with 1 acre of land. $5,500.00. 
3 bedroom, 1 bath large older type home in Carbon with 2 

lots. $17,500.00. 

Real nice 3 bedroom home on choice lot at Lake Leon. 
$55,000.00. 

Mobil home and 3 deeded lots at Lake Leon. $20,000.00. 
Extra nice home at Lake Leon with 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 

fireplace, carpet, and many extras. Approximately 2350 
square feet. 

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 
8 acres located on Interstate 20 near Ranger. 
Lot located in Eastland, 50' x 140'. Located on North Am-

merma n. 
Lot located on South Lamar in Eastland, 64'- x 75'. 

$2,500.00. 

On August 30th we met 
with 19 present. James Steel 
was unable to be there to 
give us a piano recital. 

We had 5 loal visitors, 17 
members. Leroy Woody 
played the guitar and sang, 
we also had a group singing. 

Our Thanks to Mr. Woody. 
Happy Birthday was sang 

to Mrs. Lila Clark and Mr. 
Woody. 

There was a Musical on 
Sept. 6. Mrs. Nell Maynard 

was hostess. Refreshments 
were served to all present. 

Evelyn Chick 

Team Roping To Benefit WTRC 
The team roping benefit 

for the West Texas 
Rehabilitation Center is set 
for 11 a.m. Saturday at Old 
Abilene Town are na. 

Entry fee for .  the event is 
$50 for three head, and the 
deadline for entering is 10 
a.m. Saturday. 

The winning team will 
receive a pair of handmade 
saddles; second place team 
will get buckles; third place 
team will receive spurs; and 
the fourth place team will 

get bits. 
Admission to the roping is 

$2 per person, 	with all 
proceeds going to West 
Texas Rehabilitation Center. 

"Team ropers from all 
over Texas and parts of New 
Mexico are planning to 
come, and it looks like this is 
going to be an outstanding 
event," according to Danny 
Isbell, 	WTRC 	field 
representative. For more 
information, contact Isbell 
or Sonny Dillard at (915-
692- 2811. 

Auction Sale 
SATURDAY SEPTEMBER 10, 1977 

10:00 A. M. 1204 West Main Street 
Eastland, Texas 

ITEMS TO BE AUCTIONED WILL INCLUDE — 

Frost Free Refrigerator 

Gas Range 

RCA Color TV 

White Gold French Prov. 

Bedroom Suite 

12 Gauge Shot Gun 
Hide-A-Bed 

Lamps 

Upright Deep Freeze 

Steel Kitchen Cabinet 
Dishes 

2 H.P. Gasoline Motor 

Prestolite Torch w/Drum 
3 1/2  H.P. Outboard Motor 
Rigid Pipe Wrenches 

Rigid Pipe Cutters 

Rigid Pipe Reamers 

Yard Tools 

Washer & Dryer 

2 Wheel Barrows 

Rollaway Tool Chest 

Shop Vice 

Tape Recorder 
Bar-B-Q Grill 

Electric Paint Compressor 

Refrigerated Air Conditioner 

Walnut Bedroom Suite 

Kirby Vacuum Cleaner 
Living Room Suite 

22 Cal. Bolt Action 

Coffee Table 

Gold Frame Mirror 
Utility Table 
Kerosene Lamp 

Hand Tools 
Skill Saw  

Bench Grinder 

Dinette Suite 

Yard Chairs 

Lawn Mower 

Bolt Cutters 
Extension Cords 

Coleman Lanterns 
Furniture Clamps 
Milwaukee Sawzall 

Plus 

MANY OTHER RELATED ITEMS — 

— CONCESSIONS ON GROUNDS 

DON'T MISS THIS ONE 	 

SMALL ACREAGE 
10 acres with nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath brick home. Located 

North of Eastland. $50,000.00. 
40 acres Northwest of Gorman with some peanut allotment 

$450 per acre. 
80 acres Northwest of Gorman, some cultivation and some 

peanut allotment. One- half minerals. $400 per acre. 
48 acres with a 2 bedroom home that has been remodeled. 

Good fences, water well and city water, with highway 
frontage. 35 acres in coastal. $48,000.00. 

FARMS AND RANCHES 
395 acres located on Ranger- Morton Valley highway with 

good fences, some coastal and love grass. 
265 acres East of Breckenridge that is good deer country 

with some minerals. $190 per acre. 
650 acres on Sabanna River with lots of pecan trees and 

some cultivation, Terms can be arranged. 
4020 acres in Stephens County with good fences and plenty 

of water. Lots of improved grasses. No minerals. $210 per 
acre. 

1400 acres in Eastland County with highway frontage. 
Terms can be arranged and owner will finance. A nice place. 

668 acres, some improved grasses, with a 2 bedroom home, 
on pavement, good barns and good well water. Located in 
Stephens County. 

612 acres near Lake Leon with a large 2 bedroom home, on 
pavement with 174 acres of cultivatiion, good fences, good 
peans and barn. 

451 acres located on Breckenridge highway with 60 acres 
cultivation, 10 tanks, good pens, water well with city water 
available. $260 per acre. 

415 acres Southeast of Ranger with deer and turkey. On 
Colony Creek. $300 per acre. 

344 acres with 1 mile of Leon River with a 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
2600 square foot home with a smaller 3 room, 1 bath house. 

279 acres located between Eastland and Cisco. $275 per 
acre. 

160 acres South of Cisco with highway frontrage and good 
fences. 

160 acres Southeast of Ranger with deer and half minerals. 
$325 per acre. 

152 acrs near Eastland with city water, electricity and 
telephone available. Located on Interstate 20. Will sell all or 
will subdivide. 

148 acres near Lake Leon with some cultivation, on 
pavement, some lake frontage and one- half minerals. $600 
per acre. 

83 acres with a 3 bedroom home located between Eastland 
and Carbon with 54 acres of peanut allotment 

80 acres with 40 acres cultivation and 21 acres peanuts, and 
one- half minerals. Located 3 miles West of Carbon_ $425 per 
acre. 

210 acres close to Morton Valley: on pavement with city 
water, good fences and 60 acres of cultivation. Terms can be 
arranged. $315 per acre. 

80 acres near Romney, all fenced with fair to good fences. 
$300 per acre. 

WE HAVE OTHER LISTINGS 
LARGE AND SMALL 

ALL LISTINGS WILL BE APPRECIATED ITE ALIO!? I  

WRIGHT AUCTION CO. 
JAMES T. WRIGHT, LICENSED AUCTIONEER 

BONDED — INSURED - LICENSE NO TxoC760197 
629- 8063 
629- 2443 
629- 2896 

Office Phone 629- 1725 
Hiway 80 East 

Eastland, Texas 76448 
Pat Maynard 	  
M.L. Terrell 	  
Rodger Terrell 	  

auSiNESS PHONE II 629.2461 RESIDENCE PHONE 11 7 /629.1074 
106 SOUTH SEAMAN STREET 	— 	EASTLAND, TEXAS 76441 

it ith storage on large wooded lot in Eastland's* 
new carpet- See this one to appreciate* 

* $31,000.00- No down Payment for V CLO. vii..1111411 Down Payment for FHA. 	 4( 
a 	 * Ranger * 3 
* CHEAPER THAN RENTING- - F ' 1— ---"'y and assume loan with payments of $91.00! 

*POSSESSION. 
*monthly- 2 bedroom, 1 bath, ni SOLD, carpets, utility room. IMMEDIATE; 

a 
* New on Market in Ranger- - E 	 iedroom, 1 oversized bathroom with 2 car 44 
• ports- Built- in range an oven- f SOLD'-  some drapes- air conditioner andheating- :* 
-4( Excellent condition- $19,650- VA no down payment- FHA small down payment. 	

* 
 

*  
* LOTS OF ROOM IN THIS ONE AND HALF STORY- just on market- central air- 3 
*carpets- garage- excellent condition- $22,700.00. No Down Payment Vets.- Small Down:  *Payment FHA. 
* 10 acres of pecan and fruit trees with very nice 2 bedroom, 11/2  bath formal dining and*  it 

.  *l• iving room, built- in kitchen with loads of cabinets Financing Available. 	 3 
*,. COMPLETELY- RE- MODELED- nice 2 Bedroom home with new cabinets, new: 
* carpet, freshly painted inside and out, $14,100.00. Small down payment and low monthly. * payments. * 	 3 a 	BIG AND CONFORTABLE describes the family room in this almost new A- Frame* 
* home, den, kitchen, i2 bath downstairs, 3 Bedroom, bath upstairs. A super buy at 25,000.00. : 
* 
1(  SPACIOUS 2 STORY HOME on almost 2 acres of Beautifully landscaped lot with 16 fruit * 

.1. * trees. 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, garage, central heat, built- ins. $33,000.00 FHA or VA 	* * * 
it 	 Cisco 	 a 

i• 
a 

3 2 Bedroom home with extr 

SOLD -*porch- a bargai n at $9,000.0 	
ced back yard with Pecan trees- nice big front**  

it 
* 

* 
3 air, builtins, drapes and carpet. 
* 	MINT CONDITION 3 Bedroom, II,:  soLD  ige over- sized lot, central heat and it  * 

k * 	
WE'RE READY FOR YOU to select colors on this new 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 1 car garage*  it 

*home. Built- ins- fully carpeted- central air and heat. S26.250.00 No Down Payment for* 
* Vets.- Small Down Payment FHA or ask about our trade plan.* 0(  

*stor

it 3 Bedroom, 2 ba 	
and air, corner lot, carpet, builtins drapes 12 x 20 age room A R 

 

* 	 SOLD $15,500.00 
* *  Lake Leon *  

* Lake 3 Leon lots with pecan trees rea * 	
SOLD n homes to be I ...th on them. Select one of* _scour new floor plans and let us work of 	..___ ......nancing or trading for your house. 	* 

* BEAUTIFUL TRI - LEVEL DEEDED LAKE FRONT LOT with nice 2 bedroom cottage * it 4( 
* sitting high above deep water. This place is ready to move into, fully furnished plus color * 
* TV, refrigerated air conditioning, pump house. storage house, boat deck. $18,950.00. 	3  3 

-* -* 	 Acreage With Homes 	 * lc 	 * 
* 

40 acres- 1 mile W. of Cisco, wilt barn, working pens, 3 stock tanks, 2 water(  

	

SOLD 	
,E 

4, wells- 3 bedroom, 1 bath, real it 
( * 24 Acres 1 mile North of Cisco with large 2 bedroom house with nearly new 2 car garage- : 

-* *nice cabinets, Storage building, city water- Trades considered- Call for more information., 
a  12 Acres on High ' n Eastland and Cisco with 14 x 65 Mobile Home- goods 
*water well- Call for SOLD 	 I, 4, 
4, 	 Acreage 	 -1( 3 	 a * 53 ACRES- 51 2  miles Southeast of Eastland- 2 surface tanks, coastal, public water* *available. GOOD FINANCING 	 * 4(  
* Equity Trade Plan 

	

	
* 
4  * 

* Your present house has never been worth more than it is today - - With rising building: 3 
* costs and inflation along with the increased demand for houses the equity in your present *  
* house could allow you to move into the home of your dreams, with no money down and * 
3 payments lower than you would imagine. Call today for a no cost or obligation survey of* 
* your present home. You will be amazed at what it is worth. We will trade or buy your* 

* 
4(  present house for cash. ACT NOW!!! 	 * 

* 4(  * Urgent!! We Need Listings!! 	
a 

a 
* Why wait to sell your house? We have qualified buyers ready and waiting to buy your* 
* house now. We can get you top dollar for your house now. Please call for details. 	* 
* it I( 	 Veterans No Down Payment. 	

* 
* * 
3 	 629-  1 769 	3 . 4, 
a 
'I( 
4(  EOUAL NOOSING 
ik OPPORTUNITIES 	 Citizens Realty  . 
*Carol Senkel  	 a  
-4( Ray Moody 	

.. 	 629- 1269 3 

* Wayne Durham 	 1- 725- 7279 4e*  
* it  Bill Griffith 	 6647 81623152 1: 

3 	 C.A. Fowler, Broker 	 3 3 	 629-8087 
******************************* **************4 
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BIBBY'S CREATIONS 

CITY 
OF 

RISING STAR 

BRAMLETT IMPLEMENT 
COMPANY 

BUTLER MOTOR 

COMPANY 

COTTON'S 
SERVICE STATION 

The Rising Star Kittens Play Their 

CONNIE'S 
BEAUTY SALON 

Rising Star Wildcats Face Tolar Friday Night September 9th At 8 p.m. 

In Cross Plains At 7 p.m. 

EASTLAND COUNTY 

FARM BUREAU 

ELITE CAFE 

FARMERS SUPPLY 

THE HONEY BEE 

J & S GROCERY 

FIRST STATE BANK 

This Page Is Sponsored By The Following Merchants And Supporting Fans. 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
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JENKINS 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

JONES TEXACO 

L K&R ELECTRIC 

KOUNTRY KITCHEN 

LEE'S EXXON 

LEE'S GROCERY 

H.L. KILLION 

SEPT. 8 
SEPT. 15 
SEPT. 22 
SEPT. 29 
OCT. 13 
OCT. 20 
OCT 27 
NOV.3 

%ALL GAMES BEGIN AT 7 P.M 4 

CROSS PLAINS THERE 
GORMAN 	THERE 
BLANKET 	HERE 
EVANT 	 THERE 
ACGS 	 THERE 
GORMAN 	HERE 
BLANKET 	THERE 
EVANT 	 HERE 

MARIE LUNCEFORD 
AND 

EURA BAILEY 

PALACE DRUG STORE 

RISING STAR JAYCEES 

MEDLEY 
MOTOR COMPANY 

THE PIONEER CLUB 

RISING STAR CLINIC 

RISING STAR 

OIL. FIELD SUPPLY 

STAR FLORIST 

TWIN DRILLING 
COMPANY 

STAR ROUSTABOUT 
AND 

TRANSPORT SERVICE 

SOMERFORD'S GROCERY 

U.S. POSTAL SERVICE 

WINFREY FEED 
AND 

PEANUT COMPANY 

EVA AND 
KATHY WOODY 



Ott 

"Pd ruther have one of these 
Cadillacs. Nearly everybody 
I see driving one is doing 

h good." 

You'll be doing good and doing yourself a favor when 
you get personalized checks. They add a distinctive 
look to your checking account. 

RISING STAR, TEXAS 78471 

EXCELLENCE IN BANKING 	PARKING 	• DRIVE-IN BANKING 

Cr Lei ;Tel k  
Thursday, September 8, 1977 

MARK GRIFFIN 
Sophomore 

CJC 
Mr. and Mrs. A.W. Griffin 

JOHNNY TURNER 
Junior 

Electrical Engineering 
Mrs. Dorthy Turner 

DENISE WILLETT 
HILL 
CJC 

Junior 
Law Enforcement 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Willett 

IOW 

EUGENE CHRISTIAN 
Freshman-CJC 

Auto Mechanics 
Mrs. J.C. Christian 

GERALD E. f CHILI 
McCARVER,JR. 

Midland College 
Soph.-Engineering 

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Baker 

CLARK SMITH 
Sophomore 

North Texas State Univ. 
Secondary Education 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Smith 

1$0 You're Booked 

for Higher Learnln' 

$ 
4 

STONEY SMITH 
Junior 

Texas Tech. Univ. 
Electrical Engineering 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Smith 

KEN HOUNSEL 
Freshman 

Abilene Christian Univ. 
Math & Science 

Mr. and Mrs. L.C. Hounsel 

JAMES STEEL 
Senior 

Hardin-Simmons Univ.  
Music 

Mr. and Mrs. George Steel 

BENNY ByRD 
CJC 

Freshman 
Auto-Mechanics 

Mrs. Christine Byrd 

Sipe Springs 
News 

BY MRS. JACK MILLWEF 

Mr. and Mrs. Wheat 
Nowlin and Butch Graham of 
Houston attended the funeral 
services of Carl Graham 
Wed. 

PAM HILL 
Freshman 

Abilene Christian Univ. 
Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Hill 

- - - 
P.J. Burrows of Costa 

Mesa Calif., who visited 
relatives here left Monday. 

Our community was 
saddened Monday by the 
death of Jack Graham 
brother, Carl, of Gorman, 
who passed away at Denver 
City, Monday 	Funeral 
Services were at DeLeon 
Wednesday a.m. at 10 
o'clock. A number from 
attended the services. Our 
sympathy goes out to his 
family and relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Legg of 
Rails, Tex., and Mr. and 
Mrs. Buck Weston of Carbon 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
John McKeehan this week.  

Visitors in the Cliford Hall 
Sr. home have been Carmen 
and Joy Hall their grand-
children who spent Couple of. 
weeks then Mr. and Mrs. 
W.D. M orrow. Mr. and Mrs. 
Cliford Hall, Jr. all of 
Snyder, Tex., Winston Cox. 
Ronnie Odis Cross and 
Samuel Vegilli of Alvin Tex. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dock 
Rachelo of Pioneer and Mr. 
and Mrs. James Brown and 
boy of Gorman visited the 
J.W. Prices this week. 

- - - • 
Mrs. Jo Bass of Lubbock, 

Mrs. Bomie Cambell of 
Abilene, Mary Harper of 
Rising Star and Gary Sults of 
De Leon were visitors in the 
Jack Milli:vee home this 
week. Romie and Clint Leonard 

of Levelland spent the 
holiday weekend with his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. N.L. 
Leonard. 

Fariel Jones of Houston, 
Mr. and Mrs. Duby Jones of 
Rising Star and Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Anderson and 
daughters of Snyder visited 
in the H.A. Anderson homes 
this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tooter 
Munsey of Hobbs, New 
Mexico visited her mother 
Mrs. Mimie Houser Monday. 

See by the Book 

Mr. James McKeehan of 
Abilene spent the holidays 
with his parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Quieen McKeehan. 

Mrs. Jack McKeehan 

Mr. and Mrs. Cliford Hall 
Sr. spent Sat. and Sunday 
visiting to Kemy Trsedale in 
Cleburn. 

Kincaid Red Estat€ The Jack Millwees spent 
Sat. aand Sunday with 
relatives and friends at Lake 
Proctor. 

100 South Seaman Eastland, Texas 
READY TO BUILD? Choice lots in Eastland- All 

underground utilities 100 x 150'- $4200.00. 
READY TO MOVE INTO- New 3 BR. 2 bath brick 

home- Well located- Over 1750' living area- Many 
extras too numerous to mention- $42,000.00. 

CLEAN AND NEAT- 2BR. 1 bath- Very handy to 
town- Ideal for retired couple or young family- See 
and appreciate- $16,500.00. 

BEAUTIFUL LOT and very nice 2 BR. 1 bath 
home- Trees- Workshop- Extra lots- Will like it 
when you see it- $19,950.00. 

LIVE IN THE COUNTRY- 6 acres on pavement-
- 3 bedrooms- 2 baths- 2040 sq. ft.- City Water- -
Big Garden- Close to wtown- $26,900.00. 

WANT SOMETHING EXTRA- 6 Bedrooms- 3-
1/2  bath- Large Den and fireplace- Beautiful corner 
lot- over 3600 sq. ft. living area- Pool and filter 
system- Would consider trade- $61,700.00. 

ECONOMY MINDED? 3 BR 1 bath- Close to 
hospital and clinics- Owners need to sell- Will 
entertain and offer- $7850.00. 

GET AWAY FROM IT ALL- 6 acres and small 2 
BR home at Scranton- prime land fenced and ready 
to ranch- Grow everything you need- $16,000.00. 

RAISE THE KIDS IN THE COUNTRY- Large 
Four bedroom home- Approx. 25 acres- water 
well- 3 miles off Interstate South of Ranger- Good 
hunting- lots of trees- Look and Buy- $37,500.00. 

LAKE LEON HOME- 3 bedroom- Extra nice- 
Beautiful Water_ 	t- Central Heat and air- over 
1750' living area. Fish everyday- $58,500.00. 

LOTS OF ROOM- 4 bedroom Extra nice- 2 bath 
in Ranger- Nice Lot- Fruit trees- Garden area-
Some Owner Kinancing. Extra Lots- $19,600.00, 
ACREAGE 

5 ACRES - N of Eastland- City Water- Ideal for 
mobile home- $5,700.00. 

20 ACRES - N of Eastland- Most in Cultivation 
May Split- Pecan trees- $21,500.00. 

HUNTERS SPECIAL- 40 acres- Deer & Birds-
Trees- & Hills- Will help arrange financing-
$395.00 Ac. 

IRRIGATED FARM- 44 Acres BVottom land-
lots of Native Pecan trees- very handy to town-
Unlimited irrigation water from lake- $46,000.00. 

TREES & MORE TREES- - N. of Ranger 35 
Acre- Hunt while your money grows- Close to 
town- Financing arranged- $365.00- Acre. 

40 ACRES GOOD HUNTING- South of Cisco-
Tree Covered- Deer & Turkey- $320.00 Acre. 

80 ACRES WEST OF EASTLAND- Excellent 
Hunting. Good Location- 1/4  Minerals- 2 bedroom 
house. $400.00 acre. 

100 ACRES AT NIMROD- Good Stock tank- - 25 
Acres Cultivation- Owner Financing- $320.00 acre. 

150 ACRES S. OF RANGER- - Excelelnt 
Pasture- Excellent Hunting- 3 Stock Tanks- Net 
Fences- 3 miles off IH 20- $375.00 Acre. 

150 ACRES- SE of Lake Leon- 70 Acres Coastal-
Good Fences and Creek- Good Hunting- Owner 
Financed- 375.00 acre. 

160 ACRES- ALL in Coastal- 2 Br. Home- Good 
fences- - 2 tanks- - 1 2  Minerals- No wasteland. 

222 ACRES- All improved grass- Good Net 
Fences- Excellent Hunting- Close to Lake City 
Water- $500.00 Acre. 

276 ACRES- 100 Irrigated 1/2  Minerals 6 tanks- 2 
springs- 2 water wells- 2 Br. Home & Barn Handy 
to town- $490.00 acre. 

300 ACRES- River Frontage- good fences- good 
hunting- close in- 1/2  minerals- $365.00 acre. 

387 ACRE- Sabanna Area- All in Lovegrass-
and Coastal- Sa anna River- Excellent hunting-
$375.00 acre. 

587 ACRES- CARBON- All in Coastal and 
Lovegrass- Good tank and 3 water well. Good 
fences- Owner Finance- $500.00 Acre. 

720 ACRES PALO PINTO COUNTY- Excellent 
HUNTING+ • 80 Ac. cultivation- Old Old House & 
Barns- 1/4  Minerals- $320.00 Acre. 

750 ACRES- IH 20 Frontage- Excellent Deer 
Hunting- Good Fences- Very Scenic- $300.00 Ac. 

800 ACRES- PALO PINTO COUNTY- 3 Br. 1 
bath Home- 200 Ac. Cultivated- 45 percent 
Minerals with production- $320.00 Ac. 

The Eastland Chamber of 
Commerce is happy to 
announce that throughout 
the month of September, the 
work of artist. Jan Novak of • 
Eastland. will be on display 
in the conference room of the 
Chamber of Commerce buil-
ding, for.the public viewing. 

Jan is the wife of Al 
Novak, manager of Perry's 
store in Eastland. She has 
three children. Tricia, Harry 
nd Mrs. Debi Gourley. 

An Eastland County native 
Mrs. Novak is a graduate of 
Carbon High School. She is 
the daughter of the late Mr. 
and Mrs. Elbert Richardson. 

Mrs. Novak has received 
her art training from the 
following teachers: Eloise 
Bills of Stephenville, Phyllis 
Sanders of Seymore,. and 
Jean McGee of Herford. 
Jan's work has won 'her 
numerous awards in art 
shows throughout the area. 
She is an active member of 
the Eastland County Art 
Association. 

Painting principally in oils, 
Jan prefers a realistic style, 
and has a special love for 
flowers. 

Eddie Kincaid 

629-8100 
Jim Hogan 

629-2035 

Robert Kincaid 

629-2815 



Scripture Thought 

Of The Day 
And to these also Enoch, the seventh from 

Adam, prophesied, saying, Behold, the Lord 
came with ten thousand of his holy ones, to 
execute judgment upon all, and to convict all the 
ungodly of all their works of ungodliness which 
they have ungodly wrought, and of all the hard 
things which ungodly sinners have spoken 
against him. These are mumurers, complainers, 
walking after their lust and their mouth speaketh 
great swelling words, showing respect of persons 
for the sake of advantage. (Jude 14- 16) 

Commentary 

By Myrtle Owen 
	1 

1 

First Baptist 
Chu' col 

S x 10 
GLiving color 

GPOItTIVITS 

• 

9 Plus 65c 
Film Charge 

One per subject 	Babies, Children 	Satisfaction 
Two per family w Teenagers, Adults 	guaranteed 

Thursday, Friday & Saturday 
Sept. 8 , 9, 10 

Thurs. & Fri. 
11-6 

Sat. 
10-5 

FROM OUR CHURCHES I 
Thursday, September 8, 1977 

Church 
Of 

Christ 

make you his people. Who 
delivered us from so great a 

death, and doth deliver: in 
whom we trust that he will 
yet deliver us. Be content 
with such things as ye have: 
for he hath said. I will never 
leave thee, nor forsake thee. 
So that we may Boldly say, 
The Lord is my helper, I will 
not fear what man shall do 
unto me. 
Ps. 9:10 Prov. 18:10-Isiah 

12:2. PsI. 37:25-28. Isa. 
12:22. II cor. 1:10. Heb. 
13:5,6.) Comm. Faith and 
confidence are close cousins. 
Paul had both when he said, 
"I know in whom I have 
believed and am persuaded 
that He is able to keep that 
which I have committed unto 
Horn.) 

Myrtle Owen 

the Word of God. Day by day 
we are to make the Bible the 
man of our counsel. 

From all eternity Christ 
was united with the Father, 
and when He took upon 
Himself human nature, He 
was still one with God. He is 
the link that unites God with 
humanity. "Forasmuch then 
as the children are partakers 
o f flesh and loud, he also 
himself likewise took part of 
the same" (Heb. 2:14) Only 
through Him can we become 
children of God. To all who 
believe on Him, He gives 
power to become the sons of 
God. Thus the heart becomes 
the temple of the living God. 
It is because Christ took 
human nature that men and 
women become partakers of 
the devine nature. He brings 
life and immortality to light 
through the gospel. 

May News 
wominsinimmsia- 

li% 	inla I am.% 

•;'  

asimunicva 

Selected Messages by E.G. 
White 

health, wealth, and hap-
piness. None are gifts- -
they must be earned. Many 
never or hardly ever attend 
church, support the Lord's 
work, read the Bible and 
pray an then wonder why 
spiritual poverty results. 

"What a man sows he will 
reap." "No work- - 	no 

Pay!" 
Remember, "Man's ways 

are before the eyes of the 
Lord, and he watches all his 
paths. The iniquities of the 
wicked ensnare him, and he 
is caught in the toils of his 
sin. He dies for lack of 
discipline, and because of his 
great folly is 	lost." 

Rember also to "Trust in 
the Lord with all your heart, 
and do not rely on your own 
insight. In all your ways 
acknowledge him, and he 
will direct your paths. Be not 
wise in your own eyes; fear 
the Lord, and turn away 
from evil." ( Prov. 5:21- 23; 
3:5- 6) 

Do you have to be pushed? 
Climbon your own- - its the 
way to get ahead! 

R D Williams 

First United 
Methodist 

Church  

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Todd of 
Grapevine Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Woods and children 
Suson and Glenn of Austin, 
Mr. and Mrs. O.B. 
Chambers visited with Mrs. 
Grace Glenn and Mr. and 
Mrs. W.H. Glenn and Mrs. 
Ann Rimato this past 
weekend. 

I cannot Attend Worship 
Services Because: 

Mrs. Opal Flemming is 
visiting her daughter and 
family Mr. and Mrs. Foley 
and children in Lubbock this 
week. 

Too busy 	 
Company at home 	 
Need to rest 	 
Only day logo to the 
movies 	 

Mr. and Mrs. Curly 
Simpson were guest in Mr. 
and Mrs. W.H. Glenn's 
home. 

Pleasure trip 	 
Have to go fishing  	 
Sunday's my day for golf 

Radio or TV Programs 
Jimmye Lynn Well is home 

and is doing well. 

Hypocrites at church 

Can't find time ... 	 
I'm as good as people who 

go 	  
We send children to Sunday 

School 	  
Wife won't go 	 
I don't like a certain per- 
son 	  
Have little children that 
would cry 	 
Not interested . 
It's too hot 	 
Don't have clothes to go 

Mrs. Lois Emfinger is in 
Brownwood Community 
Hospital. 

• 

Mrs. Ima Crook had as 
guest, her grandchildren 
Kathleen and Matt of Big 
Spring. 

They that know thy name 
will put their trust in thee: • 
for thou, Lord, hast not 
forsaken them that seek 

thee. 
The name of the Lord is a 

strong tower: the righteous 
runneth into it. and is safe I 
will trust. And not be afraid: 
for the Lord JEHOVAH is my 
strength and my song; he 
also is become my salvation. 
I have been young, and now 
am old: yet have I not seen 
the righteous forsaken, nor 
his seed begging bread-For 
the Lord loveth judgment, 
and forsaketh not his saints, 
they are preserved for ever: 
but the seed of the wicked 
shall be cut off-The Lord will 
not forsake his people for his 
great name's sake: because 
it hath pleased the Lord to 

CO=00000=00e1COSOCeCCPC.4  

Your 

AUTO 4PassCENTER 
Can't give the Lord any 
money 	 
Car won't run 	 
Too cold 	 
Must mow the grass 

Everyday Low Prices 

GABRIEL SHOCKS 
FRAM FILTERS 

SPARK PLUGS 
Champion 

AC 	Autolite 

Signed 	  

(Please cut out and mail to 
God) 

name. 
Though we face war and 

struggle, 
and feel their good and rod, 

We know above con-
fusion 
There always will be God". 

(Author : Dr. Albert 
Leonard Murray) 

How true this little poem 
is. "There always will be 
God!" Too' all the Devils in 
Hell may rage an rant, they 
cannot destroy God nor His 
children. 

How good it is to know that 
God is above all confusion 
and is NOT the author of 
confusion. God is the author 
of love, Joy, Peace and 
happiness. Tho hear taches 
come, Tho' disappointments 
be many, still God is God. 
We, as ministers and laymen 
alike must be led by the 
Spirit, not what man wants 
us to do, but what God in His 
great wisdom tells us to do. 

When a tiny baby is born 
into this world, he cannot 
talk or walk. Many things he 
cannot do. As the child grows 
older, he becomes able to do 
more and more. But many 
times that child ants to do 
things His parents know is 
not best for Him. Too much 
of having his own way is not 
good for him and can be the 
ruin and destruction of that 
child. He must grow and 
become mature before He 
can take on the respon-
sibility of an adult. Many 
times we felt we 'knew it all' 
long before we became an 
adult. But sometimes we 
proved we weren't grown up 
by the way we acted. 

So it is with us as Children 
of God. When we get saved 
we are Just babies in the 
Lord. And though we grow 
fast on the nature and ad-
monition of God, we must 
one day get to be a mature 
christian and act like one. 

God is love. God is gen-
tleness goodness, faith. God 
is humbleness, meekness, 
forgiving Spirit. 

God is "in love and honor 

preferring one another." 
God is "endeavoring to 

keeping the unity of the 
Faith. 

For us to grow in the Lord, 
we must decrease, and God 
must 'increase in our life. 
When we forget about "Self" 
and what "Self wants and 
put what is best' for the 
church, and great' Body of 
Christ first and foremost in 
our lives. When we "en-
deavor to keep the unity of 
the Faith" many times we 
feel mistreated and betrayed 
but we must continue to stay 
sweet in our Soul and keep 
waling in His footsteps. The 
Lord loves ALL V His 
children and wants tnem to 
walk hand inhand w ith Him 
and each other. Certainly the 
enemy of Our Soul would 
cause confusion, mistrust, 
hard feelings andetc. but 
never forget, that is the 
enemy that brings these kind 
of feelings. Let us continue to 
trust in Jesus and watch for 
His return_ He is coming 
soon. 

Vernon McGinn 
Pastor 

Are you a good Steward? 
Stewardship applys to more 
than just money. Steward-
ship applys to all of life, and 
God gives each one of us the 
same amount, twenty four 
hours each day. How we 
spend it is up to us. 

who first brought sin into the 

world. 
Christ brought men and 

women power to overcome. 
He came to this world in 
Human form, to live a man 
amongst men. He assumed 
the liabilities of human 
nature, to be proved and 
tried. In His incarnation He 
gained in a new sense the 
title of the Son of God. Said 

the angel to Mary, "The 
power of the highest shall 
overshadow thee: therefore 
also that holy thing which 
shall be born of thee shall 
be called the Son of God" 
(Luke 1:35) While the Son of 
a human being, He became 
the Son of God in a new 
sense. Thus He stood in our 
world- - the Son of God, yet 
allied by birth to the human 
race. 

Christ came 	in human 
form to show the inhabitants 
of the unfallen worlds and of 
the fallen world that ample 
provision has been made to 
enable human beings to live 
in loyalty to their Creator. 
He endured the temptations 
that Satan was permitted to 
bring against Him, and 
resisted in all his assaults. 
He was sorely afflicted, and 
hard beset, but God did not 
leave 	Him 	without 
recognition. When He was 
baptized of John in Jordan, 
as He came up out of the 
water, the Sprit of God, live a 
dove of burnished gold, 
descended upon Him, and a 
voice from heaven said, 
"This is my beloved Son, in 
whom I am well pleased" 
(Matt. 3:17) It was directly 
after this announcement 
that Christ was led by th,.• 

Spirit into the wilderness. 
Mark says: "Immediately 
the spirit driveth him into 
the wilderness. And he was 
there in the wilderness forty 
days, tempted of Satan; and 
was with the wild beasts" 
(Mark 1:12, 13.) "And in 
those days he did eat 
nothing" (Luke 4:2) 

When Jesus was led into 
the wilderness to be temp-
ted, He was led by the Sp trit 
of God. He did not invite 
temptations. He went to the 
widerness to be alone, to 
contemplate His mission and 
work. By fasting and prayer 
He was to brace Himself for 
the bloodstained path He was 
to travel. How should He 
begin His work of freeing the 
captives held in torment by 
the destroyer? During His 
long fast, the whole plan of 

His work as man's deliverer 
was laid out before Him. 

When Jesus entered the 
wilderness He was shut in by 
the Father's glory. Absorbed 
in communion with God, He 
was lifted above human 
weakness. But the glory 
departed, and He was left to 
battle with temptation. It 
was pressing upon Him 
every moment His human 
nature shrank from the 
conflict that awaited Him. 
For forty days He fasted and 
prayed. 	Weak 	and 
emaciated from hunger, 
worn and haggard with 
mental agony, "his visage 

was so marred more than 
any man, and his form more 
than the sons of men (Isa. 
52:14). Now was Satan's 
opportunity. Now he sup-
posed that he could over-

come Christ. 
There came to the Saviour, 

as if in answer to His 
prayers. one in the guise of 
an angel of light, and this 
was the message that he 
bore: "If thou be the Son of 
God, command that these 
stones be made bread' 
(Matt. 4:3). 

Jesus met Satan with the 
worlds, "Man shall not live 
by bread alort. , but by every 
word that proceedeth out of 
the mouth of God" (Matt. 
4:4) In every temptation the 
weapon of His warfare was 
the Word of God, Satan 
demanded of Christ a 
miracle as a sign of His 
divinity. But that which is 
greater than all miracles, a 
firm reliar:ce upon a "Thus 
saith the Lord" was a sign 
that could not be con-
troverted. So long as Christ 
held to this position, the 
tempter could gain no ad-
vantage. 

A familiarity with the 
Word of God is our only hope, 
Those who diligently search 
the Scriptures will not accept 
Satan's delusions as the 
truth of God. No one need by 
overcome 	by 	the 
speculations presented by 
the enemy of God and of 
Christ We are not to 
speculate regarding points 
upon which the Word of God 
is silent. All that is necessary 
for our salvation is given in 

0; 00011.9. 

bound 
TITAN ANTI FREEZE 

Cross Plains Auto Supply 
833 Main Street 	Phone: 72S-6212 

Youth 
Organization 
Elects Officers 

Even though you'll be away at 
school, we can bring you a little 
closer to home. We'll keep you 
up to date on all the local news, 
what's happening around your 
town, what friends and class-
mates are doing ... all the things 
that's of a special interest just 
to you! Plan now to take us along 
with you . . . wherever you go. 
Order you subscription to your 
hometown newspaper soon! 

An anonymous writer has 
penned the following words, 
which 1 would like to share 
with you. 
"My God and 1 raised a 

flower bed. He really did the 
most, I guess. We used his 
soil, his air, his water, his 
life, his sun. My part seemed 
so trivial that I said, "Lord, 
you take these bulbs and 
make them grow right here 
in the box in the garage." 
His reply, "Oh no. I'll do my 

part. And I'm waiting to 
begin but you must do yours, 
too. You'll have to dig the 
bed, bury the bulbs and pull 
the weeds." So I did my 
feeble part. and God took the 
bulb: burst it into life: fed it 
with his soil; showere it with 
rain; grew it with his 
sunshine...until we had a 
beautiful garden. 
Then he seemed to say. 

"Your life is like a garden 
and if you like, we'll make it 
a beautiful thing! but you 
must do the digging." 
"Lord, I said, "You just go 
ahead and make me what you 
want me to be. Make me a 
saint...give me great faith; 
fill me with compassion." 

-"Oh no," he said. "You've 
got to receive with meekness 
the implanted word (James 
1:21), keep your heart with 
all diligence (Proverbs 4:23), 
obey from the heart the form 
of doctrine (Romans 6 :17), 
hoe the weeds of evil 
(Colossians 3:5-10), chop 
away the second best 
Matthew 6:33) and I'll make 
a thing of beauty and joy 
forever: pure, clean, noble, 
useful, happy...just about 
anything good...but only if 
you dig." (end of qoute.) 
The recipe for the above 

kind of life is found in the 
Bible, God's book. Join us in 
open Bible study each 
Sunday at 9:30 a.m. and 
Wednesday at 7:30 p.m., as 
well as in the Assemblies on 
Sunday at 10:30 a.m. and 6 

p.m. 
We extend our sympathy to 

the family of Eddie 
Underwood, of Cross Plains, 
who passed away Saturday 
night. He was the brother of 
Velita Aaron. We also 
express our sympathy to 
Gregg and Kathy Goode 
(brother of Zandy Goode), at 
the loss of their infant 
daughter 	recently 	in 

Hillsboro. 
Curtis and arqueritc Alford 

have given funds for the 
purchase of a pew bible, in 
memory of Elmer Dean. 
At this writing. Clifford 

Hale was still in Hendrick 
Hospital. but still expects to 
be home very soon. Herman 
Claborn is back home and 
already at work, following 
leg surgery in Temple. It was 
good to have Kenova Weaver 
back with us after a lengthy 
illness. Marion West is home 
and doing very well. W. W. 
Ezzell expects to be able to 
resume limited activity this 
week, following his surgery. 
Leonard Harris injured his 
leg last week. 
Hope all of you had a 

pleasant and safe holiday 
period and that you are 
having a good week. Call us 
if we can serve you in any 
way. 

Owen Aikin 

• 

Officers for the Youth 
Organization were elected 
recently. 	They 	are: 
President- - Shelly 	Gray, 
Vice- President: 	Ka thy 
Woody and Secretary-
Treasurer- Dena 	Willett. 
Pastor Easley and Mrs. 
Easley help with the youth. 

The 	group 	enjoys 
fellowships, refreshments, 
and other activities following 
most Sunday evening ser-
vices. All area youth are 
invited to come and share 
this blessing. 

A Subscription To Your Hometown 
Newspaper Makes A Great Gift! 

NAME 

ADDRESS 

Seventh Day 

Adventist 

CITY 

Calvary 
Full Gospel 
Assembly 

STATE 	 ZIP 

BILL: 

Fill Out This Handy Order 

Form For Your Subscription 

You cannot push anyone 
up a ladder unless he is 
willing to go," said Andrew 
Carnegie. 

I remember when growing 
up on the farm we had a pet 
goat. As a child at times I 
had to lead her out to 
pasture. 	I 	can 	still 
remember how stubborn 
that old goat was. I could 
pull, push, and hit her but if 
she did not want to go out she 

and I had a fight on our 
hands. 

How 	difficult 	and 
frustrating it is for mothers 
and daddies to encounter the 
same attitude with their 
children. 

Kids do waste time, get 
involved in useless activities 
and ignore rules and 
regulations, don't get home 
work and lessons. Parents 
have to bring pressure bear 
as unple asant as it is at 
times. 

Parents know it to be true, 
"He who tills the soil will 
have plenty of food, but he 
who 	follows 	v. orthless 
pursuits will have plenty of 
poverty," (Proverbs 28:19) 

As a true as this proverb is 
of life in general, how even 
more important it is to our 
spiritual life. 

Can you imagine a man not 

working all week and then 
showing up on payday 
wanting you to pay him? 

Too often christians seem 
to think that God owes them 

A Subscription To Your Hometown 
Newspaper Makes A Great Gift! 

"They cannot shell His 
Temple, 

nor dynamite His throne; 
They cannot bomb His city 

nor rob Him of His own. 
They cannot take Him 

captive, 
nor strike Him deaf and 
blind, 

Nor starve Him to 
surrender. 
Nor make Him Change His 
Mind. 

They cannot cause Him 
panic, 
nor cut off His supplies; 

They cannot take His 
Kingdom, 
Nor hurt Him with their lies. 

Through all the world be 
shattered, 

His "Truth' remains the 
same. 
His rightious laws still potent 

And "Father" still His 

The Rising Star 

Before the foundations of 
the world were laid, Christ, 
the Only Begotten of God, 
pledged Himself to become 
the Redeemer of the human 
race, should Adam sin.  
Adam fell, and He who was 
partaker of the Father's 
glory before the world was, 
laid aside His royal robe and 
kingly crown, and stepped 
down from is high authority 
to become a Babe in 
Bethlehem, that by passing 
over the ground where Adam 
stumbled and fell, He might 
redeem fallen human beings. 
He subjected Himself to all 
the temptations that the 
enemy brings against men 
and women; and all the 
assaults of Satan could not 
make Him swerve for His 
loyalty to the Father. By 
living a sinless life, He 
testified that every son and 
daughter of Adam can resist 
the temptations of the one 

Ph. 643.4141 
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Brothers Drilling o. of 
Abilene spotted No. 1 Donnie 
D. Dent in the regular field 
five miles south of Cisco. 

The planned 3,800 foot 
venture is located on a 178-
acre lease. 

It spots 840 feet from the 
south and 1,980 feet from the 
east lines of Section 62, Block 
3, H&TC Survey. 

- - - 
Brown- - F.JL 	Saddler, 

Abilene, staked three Brown 
County Regular Field 
project . 

No. 15 E.W. Arledge is a 
planned, 1,274 feet try 
located three miles east of 
Cross Cut on a 102- acre 
lease. 

It spots 5,050 feet from the 
south and 1,350 feet from the 
east lines of N.B. Mitchell 
Survey 150. 

No. 16 Arledge spots 4,450 
feet from the south and 2,510 
feet from the east lines of the 
same survey. 

Other venture is No. 3 E.P. 
Kilgore, located on a 75- 
acre lease four miles nor-
theast of Cross Cut. 

Slated for 1,200 feet, it 
spots 450 feet from the north 
and 1,290 feet from the west 
lines of N.B. Mitchell Survey 
153. 

C.B. Hazel of Ranger, No. 
1 Day is a planned 3,800 foot 
wildcat for the area three 
miles souteast of Eastland. 

Drillsite is 330 feet from 
the south and 2,000 feet from 
the east lines of Nancy 
Ussery Survey. 

The lease is composed of 
436 acres. 

Rivers, Texas. Her grand- 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
F.J. Maynard of Rising Star. 

People In 
The News 

Thursday, September 8, 1977 

Senior Class Officers 

President, Randy Bibb; Marty Hill- V. 
Pres.; Jenny Walker- Secretary; Becky 
Wilson- Treas.; Diana Linney- Reporter. 

of John F. Sapp Survey 34, 
A435. 

The lease is composed of 
137 acres. 

A location was spotte on a 
78 acre lease in the Penn 
Ranger Field three miles 
northwest of Rising Star. 
It is R.O. McCarty of 

Coleman No. 6 F. W. 
Roberds. 

Site is 2,310 feet from the 
noth and west lines of 
Section 26, Block 2, ETTR 
Survey. 

east lines of Nnacy Moore 
Survey, A- 1322. 

Hawkeye Oil & Gas Corp of 
Fort Worth completed No. 2 
Weiser in the Foster (Marble 
Falls) Field 12 miles south of 
Cisco. 

Location is 467 feet from 
the north and east lines of 
Lot 8, Antonio Miller Survey, 
A- 384. 

Daily potential was 66 
barrels of 43 gravity oil, plus 
82 barrels of water. 

It is pumping from per-
lira tions at 3,091 feet to 3,100 
feet, treated with 2,500 
gallons of acid. 

It is pumping from per-
forations at 3,091 to 3,100 
feet, treated with 2,500 
gallons of acid. 

Operator set the 41/2  inch 
casing at 3,181 feet, and the 
hole is bottomed at 3,525 feet. 

Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Charlie Harrell last 
week were Charles Harrell 
of Los Angeles; Fred 
Harrell, Ed and Betty 
Harrell of Cisco; Mr. and 
Mrs. Freddie Harrell of 
Rising Star; Mrs. Edwin 
Ware and Stacy of 
Ca rrelton; 	Becky 	and 
Jennifer 	Bianchi 	of 
Carrollton and Eddie Ware 
of Brownwood. 

Jodi Hook, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Hook is spending 
the week with his grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Cole 
White. 

USDA 

f, - 

Public Library 

Interstate 20 Eastland 

LUNCHROOM MENU 
Sept. 8.14 

Arledge Petroleum Corp. of 
Dallas will drill No. 1 Roy B. 
Smith as a proposed 3,200 
foot wildcat In Eastland 
county. 
Location is three miles 

southwest of Cisco on a 170 
acre lease. 
It spots 1,200 feet from the 

south and 2,300 feet from the 
east lines of Section 104, 
Block 3, H&TC Survey. 

Mary Letha Hubbard To 
Teach At Quinlan 

Monday 
Steak 
cream potatoes 
Green Beans 
Hot Rolls 
Mixed fruit 
milk 
Tues 
Goolaush 
mixed vegetables 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Hot rolls 
Jello 
milk 

Wednesday 
Sandwiches Bologna-Pressed 
Ham-cheese 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Mayonaise & tomatoes 
chips 
apple cobbler 
milk 

QUINLAN- - A 	former 
"Miss Rising Star" and 
"Eastland County Pecan 
Queen" has been employed 
at Quinlan High School for 
the coming school year. 

Mary Letha Perkins, a 
native of Rising Star, Tex., 
which is located i 

Thursday Enchilidas w-chili 
& cheese 
Pinto Beans 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
catsup 
crackers 
mixed fruit 
milk 

Friday 
Hamburgers 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Onions & Pickles 
Mayonaise or mustard 
catsup 
Fritos 
Peach cobbler 
milk 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Terry Geye, 

Debbie and Brandon went to 
Wichita Falls to visit Mr. 
Guyle Greynolds. 

N.M. 	Scallorn 	of 
Breckenridge will plug back 
to 3,761 feet at a regular field 
project one mile northeast of 
Ranger. 

rut is No. 1 Nannie Walker 
located on a 120 acre lease. 

Site is 344 feet from the 
north and 1.300 feet from the 

Texacolada Oil Co. of 
Austin staked two wildcat 
locations two miles northeast 
of Desdemona. 
Both are slated for 3,000 

feet. 

No. 2 A.E. Henslee will be 
drilled on a 160-acre lease. 
It spots 467 feet from the 

south and east lines of M.A. 
Hamilton Survy, A-584. 
Other project is No. 2 U.V. 

Hogg, located on a 342 acre 
lease. 

Site is 2,050 feet from the 
south and 467 feet from the 
west lines of W.H. Sargent 
Survey, A-441. 

Another wildcat location 
was staked two miles east of 
Rising Star as Captial Equity 
Transfe4 Corp. of Abilene 
No. 3 J.W. Roach. 
The planned 1,375 foot 

venture is located on a 160 
acre lease. 
It spots 1,845 feet from the 

south and 1,197 feet from the 
west lines of Section 9, Block 
2, ETRR Survey. 

West Artesia Transmission 
Co. of San Antonio will drill 
No. 3 Bobby Moore in the 
regular field 10 miles 
northwest of Cisco. 
The planned 3,900 foot 

venture is located on an 80 
acre lease. 

The planned 3,900 foot 
venture is located on an 80 
acre lease. 
Drillsite is 330 feet from the 

north and east lines of 
Section 2983 TE&LO Survey. 

********************************* 

1 

Everette and Alice Harris 
visited Luther and Vera 
Forbes over the weekend. 
Mr. and Mrs. Forbes are 
going to see their son, Billy 
Forbes, who will enter a 
Midland 	hospital 	for 
surgery, Thursday. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Taylor Flicks 

of Angleton and Mr. and. 
Mrs. Tony Geye of Crowley 
were weekend visitors of 
their parents, Mr. aand Mrs. 
H.L. Geye. 

Completed in the same 
ffield 	was 	Glover 
Development Corp. No. 1 
Shook. 

Site is 1,787 feet from the 
north and 2,173 feet from the 
west lines of Section 56, 
Block 3 H&TX Survey. 

Daily potential was 36 
barrels of 40 gravity oil, plus 
10 barrels of water. It is 
pumping from perforations 
at 3,102 20 feet, treated with 
6,000 gallons of acid. The pay 
was fractured with 80 sacks 
of sand. 

Operator set the 41/2  inch 
casing at 3,175 feet, one foot 
off bottom. 

Nordan Oil & Gas Corp. of 
Abilene will drill No. 1 Byrl 
Warren as a propsosed 3,200 
foot wildcat in Eastland 
County. 

Location is six miles north 
of Gorman on a 70- acre 
lease. 

It spots 1,980 feet from the 
south and 430 feet from the 
west lines of S.F. Choat 
Preemption Survey. 

Rhodes Drilling Co., 
Abilene, willkplug back to 
3,100 feet at a regular field 
project four miles northeast 
of Rising Star. 

It is No. I Ressie Cham-
bers, located on a 80- acre 
lease. 

Site is 4,559 feet from the 
south and 6,849 feet from the 
west lines of James Jett 
Survey, A- 333. 

It was previously com-
pleted by the same operator 
as an oiil well from per-
forations at 3,278- 90 feet. It 
was originally drilled to a 
depth of 3,350 feet. 

Eastland- Sckade The 
Good Book 

Place: 
The Eastland 

Telegram 
629-1707 
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\ The Rising Star 

coordina tor. 
In college, she had the 

honor of being on the 
President's Honor Roll and 
the Dean's List for several 

_ semesters. 
Mary Ann also attended 

Tarleton State University. 
She was employed in the 

office of the dean of the 
College of Sciences- and 
Technology while attending 
East Texas. 

The new Quinlan teacher is 
a member of the Texas State 
Teachers Association 
(TSTA) and the home 
economics 	professional 
organ iza tion. 

She was married on Jan. 
25, 1974, to Thomas W. 
Perkins of Rising Star. 

The couple resides in 
Commerce, where he is 
employed as a computer 
operator at ETSU. 

Mrs. Perkins and her 
husband enjoy playing tennis 
in their spare time. 

They are members of the 
First Baptist Church at 
Posey. 

Her parents are Mr. and 
Mrs. H.D. Welch of Abilene. 
Her sister, Linda Burn's 
teaches in the Rising Star 
School System and Her 
brother teaches in Three 

GO! 

n the 
central part of the state, 
replaces Sara Moss in the 
School's homemaking 
department. Returning as 
homemaking teachers at the 
school this year are Nelma 
Dodd and Anna Sandlin. 

Mrs. Perkins graduated 
from Rising Star High School 
and Cisco Junior College in 
Cisco, Tex., and then at-
tended East Texas State 
University in Commerce, 
where she received her 
degree in 1976. 

Following graduation from 
ETSU, she taught high 
school home economics at 
North Hopkins School, which 
is located near Sulphur 
Springs, Tex. Students from 
kindergarten through the 
12th grade attend the school. 

She accepted her position 
at the Quinlan school this 
summer, and is employed as 
Home Economics 
Cooperative 	Education 
(HECE) teacher- 

0 
r 
k 

e 
r 
r 

r 

Louisana Crude Oil & Gas 
Inc. of New Orleans spotted 
No. 2 Maples Drewery in the 
Foster Marble Falls Field 10 
miles northast of Rising 
Star. 

Slated for 3,100 feet it spots 
467 feet from the north and 
3,468 feet from the east lines 

Texas Office Of Traffic Safety 

is open Tuesdays and: 
:Thursday from 9 to 12:00 Noon.:1- 

We urge you to use this facility: «  
4,  Librarian is on duty. 

Rising Star 
High School 
Homecoming 
October 	8th anw. nuvii 
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YOU'LL LOVE THESE e 

for $100  
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CORN 12 
Mix or Match 

BELL PEPPERS 
CUCUMBERS 

for 

STOCK-11P 
i  Nabisco 

VANILLA 
WAFERS 

12 oz. 

S9c  
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st White 

GRAPES L. 49 .... 
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Special 
Regular Size 

COKE 
or MORE ..... 5 32 oz. Returnable for Your Fbod Stamps Here' „, 	 

V. 
 

f 
I 6 pk. 

k 

$139 ry 

DR. PEPPER 
64 oz. 

non-returnable 
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TOWELS 

2 for  9 
For Our Customers Convenience 

Our New Store Hours WIN Be 

Monday-Saturday 7:30-7:00 

Sunday 9 a.m. to 1 p.m. 
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Hamburger 
Order French Fries 

Small Drink 

7:4 
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Southwestern 
Section-Prices for Jumb 
runners were slightly highe 
in the Southeast the wee 
ending September 2. 
Trading was active for larg 
size peanuts and slow fo 
others. New crop sales fo 
prompt through next Apri 
shipment per pound fo 
shelled runner type sold on 
an FOB shipping point basis 
at mostly 35 three fourth-36 
cents on Jumbos, us ones at 
32-321/2  and splits mostly 
28'/2 cents per pound. The 
peanut crop continued to 
make good progress in 
Georgia 	and 	other 
Southeastern States. 
Moisture was generally 
ample. Insect and disease 

control continues. Harvest is 
increasing and should be 
very active the balance of 
September. 

Virginia North Carolina 
Section-The crop made good 
progress in this area the 
week ending September 2. 
Temperatures were hot 
during the day and moisture 
was sufficient in most Peanut 
fields. Insect control was a 
problem. Practically all old 
crop supplies were cleaned 
up. Trading on new crop was 
slow on most grades. Sellers 
and buyers needed a little 
more time to size up the 
crop. Prices paid per pound 
for new crop Virginia type 
Peanuts sold on an FOB 
shipping point basis for 
October through March 
shipment for unshelled 
Jumbos mostly 35-351/2  
Fancies 321/2 -33 and shelled 
extra large 391/2 -38 and splits 
ranged 26 1/4 -27 1/2  with a few 
October shipment and high 
split content 28-29 cents per 

poun  Southeastern 
Section-Peanuts made 
progress in the Southwest 
e week ending September 
The New Mexico crop was 
excellent condition and 

.0 to three week of normal. 
klahoma 	received 
ditional 

oisture last weekend. That 
op is in good condition. 
he Texas crop was 
mewhat variable. The 
igated crop was in good 
ndition. Central Texas 
rms were in need of rain. 
s_ease prevailed in some 
ea. 	Harvesting is 
derway in South Texas. 
t is lagging due to slow 
turity. Trading was slow 
e to the light supplies 
ailable. Prices were firm. 
cc s paid per pound for 
w crop Spanish type 
anuts sold on an FOB 
pping point basis for 

ompt through December 
pment for shelled number 
s 361/2 .37 Jumbos Few 37 
nd us splits 29-30 cents 
pound. A few runner 

mber ones sold at 35 1/2  
runner splits 281/2 • 
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SLAB 

BACON 
NOW $129 

CLUB 

STEAKS 

Sr  

gat 
afltWe Reserve The Right To Limit 

Hormel 
keg. Si,, it.  
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J & S Grocery 
Home Owned & Operated. 

Wednesday, Sept. 14 at 6:00%t; • 
Saturday, Sept. 10 at 6:00 'A 

Two $29" Cookware Sets 
To Be Given Away 

Drawings Will Be 

97c 

4.0 
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94.•;00!":14.7- 
'costae 


	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3
	Page 4
	Page 5
	Page 6
	Page 7
	Page 8
	Page 9
	Page 10

