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Rising Star, Texas 

According to the calendar, 
April 20 was designated as the 

I first day of spring and usually 
that day is heralded with much 
pleasure and anticipation, but 
to most of us, last Saturday was 
just another rainless day; even 
the song of the robin and the 
bloom of whatever flowers 
have managed to emerge from 
this parched earth, brought 
little reason for rejoicing. 

We have received reports of 
various rain - making devices 
and methods,. One in particular 
was a headliner used by one of 
Rising Star's former editors 
which read "Wanted - - three 
inch soaker" - - now 1 rather 
doubt that this brought any 
visible results - but you have 
to give the man credit for 
trying. 

A pat on the hack to the local 
chairman of Bicentennial 
activities, Mr. Owen Aikin, for 
the fine job he is doing in in-
stigating the various Bicen-
tennial projects here on the 
local scene. It is hoped that 
every individual will have an 
opportunity to participate in 
the celebration of this nation's 
200th birthday. 

Have you noticed the im-
provements that have been 
made to the Little League 

' baseball park? The Jaycees are 
to be commended for this ef-
fort, and parents of Little 
Leaguers are urged to come out 
and participate with their boys 
in this program of summer 
activity 

County-Wide 

Walkathon 

Slated For 
April 3 

V 

A county - wide Walkathon is 
scheduled for Saturday. April 3, 
in Ranger. 

This event is sponsored by 
the March of Dimes and 
coordinated by Mrs. Dewey 
Cox, County Chairperson. and 
the various FIIA organizations. 

Local merchants who have 
contributed funds for the noon 
meal which will be served to 
the "walkers" include: The 
Rising Star, MS Automotive, 
Kountry Kitchen. Davey Jones 
Texaco. D&T Lumber, Parent 
- Teachers' 	Organization, 
Cecil's Truck Stop and the 
Saturday Club. 

The Walkathon will begin at 
8:00 a.m. al Ranger Junior 
College, continue to the Ranger 
Country Club and back to 
Ranger Junior College - - a 
distance of 21 miles. 

The Rising Star FHA will 
sponsor a rest slop for the 
walkers. Proceeds from the 
Walkathon will be used to 
establish a scholarship fund in 
Eastland County, one at RJC 
and one at CJC, to be used for 
Eastland County youth. 

Prizes will be given for 
outstanding walkers. Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Dennard contributed 
one of these prizes. 

Prospective walkers will be 
contacting local residents for 
sponsorship of the walk. 

P.T.O. To Present 

One-Act Plays 
The \Rising Star PTO will 

sponsor two one - act plays. 
These will be presented in May. 

- Anyone who wishes to par-
ticipate in this project as a 
character in a play, please 
contact David Harris, 3 - 7142 
or Norma Carpenter, 3 - 2212. 
Rehearsals will begin Monday, 
March 29, at 7:30 in the high 
school library. 

To the Voters of Constable 
Precinct Three, Eastland 
County: 

As you know I am a candidate 
for Constable of this Precinct of 
Eastland County, subject to the 
will of the Democratic voters in 
primary next May. 
I offer you 

qualifications: 
Years of experience as a 

constable in the office I seek, 
and many other years of ex-
perience in Police Departments 
and other areas of official law 
enforcement and private 
employment of the nature. 

Certification by schools for 
law enforcement officers as 
required by the laws of this 
state. 

A thorough knowledge of the 
people and the conditions of our 
community and the precinct by 
reason for a long residence. 

A pledge that if elected, I will 

as my 

W.H. KORNEGAY 
give loyal, prompt and un-
biased service to the residents 
of this precinct and especially 
to the young people in our 
community. 

I will appreciate your votes 
and influence in my behalf. 

Sincerely, 
W.H. (Hamp) Kornegay 

/-- 

I 

r 

"Look upon this picture, and on this, the counterfeit presentment of two 
brothers", Hamlet (Craig Campbell) confronts his mother, Queen 
Gertrude (Tattle Beggs) with angry accusations in a scene from the piay. 
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Local Youths 

Take Honors 

At County Show 
A 1215 pound Charolais- 
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Angus cressbred .steer owned 
by Neil (Scott-  of Rising Star 
was named Grand Champion 
Steer of the Eastland County 
Stockshow Saturday. Neil is an 
eighth grade 4- H Club member 
and the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Payton 'Scott. 

Among other highlights of 
Saturday's show was the 
naming of the Grand Champion 
beef heifer, Terrye Jeff's 
Hereford heifer was Grand 
Champion. Terrye is a Gorman 
4- H member and the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Bill Jeffs of 
Gorman. , 

Jimmy Thompson's 
Limousin Angus crossbred. 
steer was Reserve Grand 
Champion steer of the show. 
Jimmy is a Gorman 4- H 
member Diana McCaghren, a 
Nimrod 4- H girl, exhibited the 
Champion light weight steer 
and a Cisco 4- H boy, Kory 
'Wallace, was the exhibitor of 
the Reserve Champion light 
weight steer. 

Brad Fortune a Rising Star 
4- H member, showed the 
Champion Angus heifer and 
Jimmy Donham, Nimrodl 4- H 
member owned the Champion 
Angus heifer of all other 
breeds. 
The following is a list of win-
ners in Saturday's show: 
light 	weight 	steers 

These Jaycees are proud of the improvements recently made on the Little 
League Baseball Park. Shown here left to right: Ricky Bailey, David 
Pollock, Gary Wilson and little son, Ray Daniel, Bob Clark and David 
Harris. 

Jaycees Provide Facilities For 
Little League Program 

CITY DUMP? No, this is an example of blatant disregard of private 
ownership and pollution control. 

Illegal Dumping: 
A "Pollution Of Citizenship" -- Need Cooperation Of Parents An example of what can be 

done when dormant resources 
are linked to youthful enthu-
siasm is on display at City Park 
now. 

It is a community ball field, 
suitable for Little League-type 
and soft ball play, strongly 
fenced and beautifully levelled 
and sodded at the expense of 
many manhours of labor on the 
part of some 20 to 30 young 
Rising Star men and the help 
and contributions of local 
business houses and indivi-
duals. 

The Rising Star Jaycees, 
sponsors of the lighted field and 
of the summer-time "Little 
League" and soft ball activities 
to be centarcd there, expect to 
open it formally with a 
area-wide soft ball tournament 
the first week in May, said Bob 
Clark, president of the group. 
Meanwhile the grass seeded to 
the newly levelled diamond and 
outfield must be allowed to 
grow into a substantial turf and 
there are numbers of small 
construction details and organi-
zational matters to be. taken 
care of. 

Little League-type play is 
expected to get under way two 
weeks following the closing of 
school, said David Harris, one 
of the prime movers in the 
program. Harris said they hope 
to have four teams and that 
separate girls teams will be 
encouraged. 

What the Jaycees need and 
hope for is more parental 
cooperation. It has been lacking 
'IT 

No, this is not the city dump. 
It is some of the accumulated 

filth of our so - called 
civilization, illegally and 
covertly dumped along a 
county road some six or seven 
miles north of Rising Star. 

down into that stream and 
along it to Proctor Lake. from 
which so much of the drinking 
water of a large area of Texas 
is drawn. It pollutes more 
directly the place upon which it 
lies and the area about it - - an 
area of good ranches, tidy 
fences and fine cattle, 
testimonial to the pride, the 

Hardly a mile from the 
Sabanno its pollution washes 

in previous efforts of the young 
men to provide a wholesome 
outdoor recreational program 
for community youth. 

"Many parents just brought 
their children to the park and 
left them with us. What we 
need is some help that parents 
can provide--coaching and offi-
ciating especially." 

The field, newly enclosed by 
some 700 feet of non-climable 
metal fence, established in 
Concreted corners, and 36 
inches high. grew out of a 
Jaycee project of sponsoring 
youth baseball teams last year. 
Just to keep the record straight 
the Jaycee program is not 
affliated with the Little League 
program for a number of very 
good reasons having to do with 
the type of regulation and 
facilities required for such 
membership. But the local 
league play is conducted along 
similar lines and offers all fo 
the local benefits of the 
nationally organized program. 

The young men were so well 
pleased with the result of their 
sponsorship that they launched 
into an amibitious effort to 
provide further play this year. 
The consequence is a well--
lighted layout, protected and 

Rising Star Roping Club 

Slates Election Of Officers 

landscaped that will accom-
modate large numbers of 
spectators without intrusion 
upon the field of play. It is the 
result of many man-hours of 
off-duty and Sunday afternoon 
cooperative work, contributions 
of money materials. services 
and labor by business men, city 
and county agencies. such as 
county commissioner L.T. O-
wen, and by individuals not 
affiliated with the Jaycees but 
anxious to have part with them 
in a project of such community 
meaning. A list of those making 
contributions was furnished The 
Rising Star. 

The soft ball tournament 
planned to open the field iii 
early May will invite soft ball 
teams from a wide area, the 
Jaycees said. Trophies will be 
awarded the winning teams. 

Contributions to the baseball 
fund were made by Vonnie 
Ware, D. and T. Bldg. Supplies, 
West Texas Utilities, The 
Rising Star, Davey Jones. A.D. 
Jenkins. Bibby's Creations, 
Palace Drug Store, Lee's Food 
Market, Bill Medley, H.M. 
Jones. J.A. Rutherford, Eva 
Woody, John Bishop, Jake 
Somerford, Rising Star Cham-
ber of Commerce, Higginbo- 

thrift and the good character of 
the men and women who own 
and operate them and make a 
substantial and worthy con-
tribution to the economy of this 
section. 

To say that they are unhappy 
with this wholesale dumping, 
this blight upon the results of 
their industry and good 
citizenship, is putting it mildly. 

But it suggests an even more 
serious pollution - - a pollution 
of citizenship. 

The very mass of 	the 
dumping means that it is not 
the work, or rather the sin, of 
only two or three people. It has 
an aspect of some community 
collusion, a disposition on the 
part of a considerable number 
of people to ignore any 
responsibility for the welfare of 
others - - a disposition to be rid 
of a problem in the easiest way 
possible and without any 
regard for the rights and health 
of others. 

The suggestion that there is 
so much of a secret and anti -
social attitude among so many. 
people can be sobering. It can 
even be frightening. 
• Steps are being taken to call 
the dumping to the attention of 
state and county officials 
concerned with health con-
ditions. 

Champion- Diana MeCaghren, 
Nimrod 4- H 
Reserve Champion- Kory 
Wallace, Cisco 4- H 
3rd- 4  Joh- iinny McCaghren, 
Nimrod 

 

4th True! Hart, Eastland 4 - ri 
5th Scott Foster, Ranger 4 - H 
6th- Ron Butler, Ranger FFA 
7th il Rruetexha  Hart.TEacsktlearsndon,4 - H 
8 t h 
Ranger] FFA. 
9th Bobby Jaye -Gorman FFA 
10th- Johnny Stewart- Ranger 
FFA 
Heavy Weight Steers 
Champion- Neil Scott, Rising 
Star 4- H 
Reserve Champion- Jimmy 
Thopson, Gorman 4- H 
3rd- jimmy Thompson, 
Gorman 4- H 
4th Theresa Scott, Rising Slat:  
4-H '  
6th- Bud Jeffs, Gorman 4- H 
7th  o  Cn  at irnyune d  Lee,c  Cisco  

n Page 
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Their private pleasure in 
roping and riding attracted so 
much interest that the club 
launched into a public program 
of weekly rodeo entertainments. 
The Chamber of Commerce 
helped by providing a tract of 
land of Highway 36 east of 
town, and the club launched 
into a project of arena building-
by its own Hands and funds, 
incidentally--which resulted in 
an arena accommodating 2,500 
spectators and well equipped 
with pens. chutes, announcer 
platforni. etc. The arena has 
been the scene of a summer 
rodeo series uninterrupted for 
23 seasons. 

The Roping Club hopes to 
make it 24 more. 

Present officers arc Harris, 
president; Delbert Tarver. vice-
president; Joy Harris. secre-
tary: Shelly Bailey. treasurer; 
Jimmy Rutherford, arena direc-
tor: and C.w.  . Richter. A.D. 
Jenkins. Jay Coker. Gary 
Wilson. directors. 

'Hamlet' 
Reservations 
Start Sunday 

Beginning at.1 p.m. today.  
(Sunday i reserva lions in ill 
be taken for Eastland Civic 
Theatre's production of 
-Hamlet" which opens on 
Thursday, March 23. at Bell 
Hurst Playhouse. 

Performances will be at 8 
p.m. on Thursday. Friday 
and Saturday with a 
matinee al 2 p.m. on Sun-
day. March 26. 

Reservations may be 
made by calling the number 
of the theatre in Eastland, 
629 - 1141, or that of Mrs. 
Bill Dreinhofer in Ranger. 
647 - 3094. 

Virginia Russell. director 
of the play. says that she 
feels the young and those 
who are unfamiliar with the 
play w ill enjoy it as much as 
those who have read it. A 
favorite quote of hers is 
from C.J. Cisson, a British 
editor: 

"Let the young conic to 
Shakespeare as he would 
have wished, to a play, not 
to a book. Every time I go to 
see a Shakespearian play. I 
seek to empty my mind of 
past knowledge and to sit 
down as to a new unknown 
play." 

Kornegay Announces 

For Constable 

The Rising Star Roping Club. 
facing a challenge in continuing 
the 23i-year series of weekly 
rodeos, will meet at 7:30 p.m.. 
Friday, April 2. at the commu-
nity room of the First State 
Bank. it was announced this 
week by the club president 
DavidHarris. 

New officers will be chosen 
and plans for the summer series 
to start in May or early June will 
he discussed. 

The club is depending heavily 
upon substantial evidence of 
local support in making its 
plans. Harris said. 

He and most of the members 
of the official group are 
members of a younger genera-
tion which has taken over rodeo 
sponsorship from the older men 
and women who developed it in 
the early fifties from the 
activities of a private group of 
quarterhorse and western horse 
enthusiasts drawn together for 
the single purpose of keeping a 
to% e of good horses alive and 
entertaining. 

Local Voters 
To Elect City 

And School 

Officials 

Federal Retirees Plan • 
Eastland Meeting 

Rising Star voters will cast 
ballots in the April 3 election of 
both city and school officials. 

In the city election, two 
places on the City Council will 
be filled from a field of three: 
W.A. Richburg, John W. Lee 
and John McCuistion. 

Voters in the Rising Star 
Independent School District 
will elect two trustees to the 
Board of Education. Four 
candidates have filed for 
election to this office: R.L. 
(Bob) Rust, Bernie Barnes. 
David Harris and Woodrow 
Harris. 

Both Richburg and Lee have 
served previous terms as 
councilmen. The remaining 
candidates in both the city and 
school election are newcomers 
to city and school politics. 

The joint election will be held 
at the City Hall in Rising Star 
on April 3, 1976. 

Weldon Roach and Miss 
Elizabeth Robertson will serve 
as election judges. 

Polls will open at 7:00 a.m. 
and close at 7:00 p.m: 

Miss Bertha Faye Strange of 
Bangs, a Federal Retiree of the 
Department of Agriculture and 
a member of the Brownwood 
Chapter, will show her Mexico -
slides. Members are invited to 
bring guests and area retirees 
are welcome to attend and 
urged to join the organization. 
No reservations are necessary 
for the dinner. 

Chapter 555 of the National 
Association of Retired Federal 
Employees (NARFE) will 
meet Monday, March 29,' 1976, 
at the Ramada Inn in Eastland. 
The? p.m. dinner is a change in 
time and members are to note 
the later meeting time. The 
business session installation of 
officers will be at 8 p.m. 
followed by a program on 
Mexico. 



[THE 	CROWN 
Medium firm, button tuft-
ed, ideal for children. One 
year guarantee. Mfg. Sug. 
Retail 559.00. Now $34.90. 
Western Mattress Co., 
1507 Austin Ave., Brown-
wood, Texas. Phone 643- 
4141 in Rising Star. 4-tfc 
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Ini';'T LET ANYONE 
TELL VOL Tu.vr VOL 

CAN'T 

AFFORD YOUR OWN 
HOME 

Lei us show you how our 
financing plan can 11.1p you 
Turn Ihr dream of a spacious 
new all brick lunor into a 

hyinf reality 

t all K. B. II 	's Collect 

•;17 • 	112- :9121 

NI1:111%,  112-  29711  
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The Rising Star Jaycee 
Organization meets on -
Thursday evening at 8:00 In 
the Scout Hut. 

Bob Clark-Pres. 
Ronnie Wilson-Sect. 

Jim Rutherford, Treas. 

NEW HOMES 
Mike Bowden Construction 
in Cross Plains, Texas. Also 
backhoe service, septic 
tank and oilfield work. Ph. 
817 - 725 - 6344. 10 - 3 mo. 
pd.  

Now is the time to select 
your family cemetery lot 
and appropriate memorial. 
Choose a permanent 
marker of high quality, 
dedicated to the one you 
love. All types granite and 
marble. Also curbing and 
marble chips. 

GOSS MONUMENTS 
Katherine Goss 

203 N. Main 
76471 11 

Rising Star, 
- 4tc AB PRINTING 

For Big 
Events! 

A very special 
occasion needs 
a very special 
printer. Ask us. 

Your Local 

Newspaper 
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Page 2 Thursday, March 25, 1976 
BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONALN  

DIRECTORY 
NOTICE FOR SALE WANTED WV. O'BRIEN, Publisher 

MRS. GEORGE STEEL, Editor 
Second Class Postage paid at Rising Star, 
Texas, under Act of Congress on March, 
1870. 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES: In Rising Star 
and adjoining counties, $4.00 per year; in 
Texas, $5.00 per year; elsewhere in the U.S. 
and foreign countries, $8.00 per year. 
NOTICE: Any erroneous reflection upon 
the character, standing, or reputation of 
any person, firm or corporation which may 
appear in the columns of this newspaper 
will be gladly corrected upon being brought 
to the attention of the editor. All ad-
vertising orders are accepted. 

FOR SALE 
•• 

We pay highest prices for scrap 
iron and metal. 

Call us collect for more in-
formation. Ph. 915 - 646 - 7058, 
Brownwood Iron and Metal Co., 
1500 Melwood 37 - tfc 

FOR 	SALE--IRRIGATION 
EQUIPMENT--A complete line 
of irrigation equipment. Sub-
mersible, centrifugal and tur-
bine pumps. pipe, fittings, 
volume guns and circle system. 
Let us help you with your 
irrigation needs. Machine Shop 
and parts for pump repair--test 
pit facilities. Also come take a 
look at our Herbicide Chemical 
Applicator for chemical distri-
bution through irrigation lines. 
Largest supply in Central 
Texas. 

KIMMEL IRRIGATION 
SUPPLY. INC. 
HIGHWAY 16 

DELEON, TEXAS 76444 
PHONE 817-893-6266 

FOR SALE - - small grocery 
store, well stocked, good 
business. $2,000. Phone 643 -
2492. 7 - tfc 

NOTICE••I have several panics 
interested in leasing land for oil 
and gas exploration in the 
Rising Star area. If you are not 
leased, please contact me for an 
offer. Charles Rutherford. Ph. 
64 3-45 81. 29-tfc 

D. Merle M Ellis 
Optometrist 

308 Citizens Nat'l Bank 

Building 
Brownwood, Texas 

GLASSES 

CONTACT LENSES 
Call 646 - 8778 

or Write P.O. Box 149 

PLUMBING PROBLEMS 
Call Hutchens Plumbing 
Co. for dependable and 
reliable service, reasonable 
rates. Water beaten also 
sold and installed. Licensed 
and Bonded. 

442.3803 
LEWIS HUTCHENS 

Rt. 2, Box 70 
Cisco, Texas 

FOR SALE--3 bedroom home.  
Living room, dining room and 
kitchen combination, bath, uti-
lity room, carport and storage 
room. Fully carpeted except 
kitchen and utility room. Ph. 
643-2452. Rising Star. 414 N. 
Main. 49-tfc 

WANTED - - Twilite Acres 
Nursing Home is accepting 
applications for relief LVN, 
immediate position available. 
Phone 643 • 2681. 4 - tic 

WE CAN BUILT for you a new 3 
bedroom brick home with 
central heat and air. Low down 
payment. Monthly payments 
565 if you qualify. For more 
information call H&W Develop-
ment Co.. 629-1702. 
4 8-tf 

WANTED--Bermuda grass • 
sprigging. Have new 4 row 
spriggcr. Phone 643.3137, R.L. 
(Bob) Rust. 2-tfc 

[2-271 
FOR SALE--2 bedroom home, 2 
acres land. Fruit trees, garden. 
Located 1 mile outside city 
limits. Ph. 643-2251. Jenkins 
Insurance Agency. 37-tfc 

• 
rr t. eA.N.liN1.4..%%•%%‘11.11.‘‘..1611"1" 

ilt NOTICE-Income tax returns 
prepared. annual and quarterly 
reports. bookkeeping and no-
tary public service. Phone 725-
6156. Mrs. W.R. (Pat) Erwin. 
2-tfc 

M. L. TERRELL 	•-: • .... 
sok , arti, • 

villf,"  1  

ft-- •Ar-

m  la 

Fast, Dependable 
Film Developing 

Palace Drug Store 

Rising Star, Texas 

WANTED 
Large health care facility in 
Cisco area needs RN 
Director. Salary 5900-51000 
a month, depending on 
experience. 
Call 915-643-1863. t-I9 

ALFORD DRILLING CO. '; 
Water wells, shallow oil 0 
wells, See Tommy or 

• Curtis.2tfc  64 Phone 817-3-2394 0  • 5  
• 

• 
V1.160%.1‘%•.•%1 

ZAL FOR SALE--Two bedroom -
home, one bath, kitchen-dining 
room combination, carport, lot 
well located in new addition. 
$12,000. Jenkins Insurance 
Agency. Phone 643-2251. 1-tfc 

FOR SALE--I1 ft. Frigidaire 
refrigerator, good condition. 
550, Phone 725-7282, J.M. 
Greenwood, 41/2  miles south of 
Cross Plains. Texas on 279. 
12-3ic 

HIGHWAY 80 EAST 

PHONE 429-1723 	NIGHTS 41.29.24O 

NOTICE - - Twilite Acre 
Nursing Home needs full time 
LVN for 3 - 11 shift. Ph. 643 -
2681. 7 - Etc 

	 • 

SMALL ACREAGE 
8 Acres located on Interstate near Ranger. 
11 Acres at Olden, with nice rock home with carpet and paneling, 

lots of fruit trees, good fences, nice barns, and city water. 
40 Acres near Kokomo on pavement with 171/2  acres peanut 

allotment. 
5 Acres at Morton Valley with 3 bedroom house and barns with 

good fences, and city water. 
HOUSES 

3 bedroom, 2 bath new home, brick with fireplace on corner lot 
with built - ins. Well financed. 

3 bedroom, 1 bath older type home, paneled and carpeted in good 
location. Nice house. $21,000.00. 

In a good location, 3 bedroom, 1 bath, carpeted with central heat. 
Shown by appointment only. $21,000.00. 

3 bedroom, 1 bath in good location. $18,500.00. 
2 bedroom house on Mulberry Street with corner lots. 
Nice 2 bedroom home with central heat, paneled and carpeted; 

has extra lot on Gilmer Street $13,500.00. 
New duplex under construction, carpeted, central air and heat, 

with garages and storage. 
4 bedroom, 3 bath, big house on Dixie Street. Shown by ap-

pointment only. 
Nice 2 bedroom house located on Seaman Street corner lot; 

furnished $16,800.00. 
At Morton Valley: station, store building, fixtures. $6,500.00. 
Duplex on South Walnut Street. $5,750.00. 
6 lots in the City of Ranger, good location. 
2 lots in Olden with 2 bedroom house on corner lot. $10,500.00 

FARMS AND RANCHES 
75 acres west of Cisco, 1 mile off I - 20 with good fences and some 

improved grasses. $350.00 per acre. 
80 acres near Okra on pavement. $400.00 per acre. 
300 acres, 1 mile East of Eastland with 1 mile of Leon River, good 

fences and half minerals. $375.00 per acre. 
208 acres with 3 bedroom home, 80 acres of cultivation, water 

well; northwest of Eastland. Terms can be arranged. 
160 acres south of Cisco with highway frontage, good fences. 
328 acres in Stephens County. $262.50 per acre. 
320 acres with all improved grasses, good fences, 1,42  minerals. 

$350.00 per acre with good terms. 
160 acres with a 3 bedroom home, fireplace, 2 good tanks, natural 

gas, on pavement, city water with some love grass. 
150 acres South of Eastland, 140 acres in coastal, good fences on 

county road with city water. $425.00 per acre. 
143 acres northwest of Ranger, with 52 acres of peanuts, $375.00 

per acre. 
74 acres with cultivation on County Road north of Eastland with 

city water on pavement. $400.00 per acre. 
120 acres on Sabanna River, pecan trees, deer and turkey, half 

minerals. Good terms. 
74 acres north of Eastland with city water on pavement. $400.00 

per acre. 
140 acres close to Eastland with 2 bedroom home, good barns, 

good fences, $450.00 per acre. 
544 acres with coastal and other improved grasses, good terms, 

some minerals. 
815 acres south of Cross Plains with deer and turkey. Ap-1  

proximately half minerals. 
1450 acres near Albany with approximately $900.00 a month oil 

income, on pavement. $225.00 per acre. 
1297 acres in Eastland County with some cultivation and im- 

proved grasses, good place. 
150 acres north of Eastland on pavement with 77 acres of 

cultivation, and city water. $400.00 per acre. 
138 acres, 11 acres peanut allotment, 5 miles west of Rising Star. 

$235.00 per acre. 
604 acres near Putnam, fair fences, with three stock tanks. 

$210.00 per acre. 
80 acres southwest of Cisco, good fences, two stock tanks, and 

half minerals, with a 2 bedroom home. 
163 acres, 3 bedroom home, all coastal, good fences, and barns. 

Located in the Carbon area. $475.00 per acre. 
668 acres, some improved grasses with a 2 bedroom house, good 

barns, good well water, located in Stephens County. 
160 acres southeast of Ranger, deer and 1,2 minerals. $300.00 per 

acre. 
198 acres with 3 bedroom home on pavement with city water, 70 

acres of cultivation near Lake Leon. 
245 acres, 7 miles southeast of Eastland with city water, 1/2  

minerals, $325.00 per acre. 
224 acres improved grasses with good fences and good set of 

pens. $10,000.00 down, owner will finance. $315.00 per acre. Location 

near acres
Car bon. 

215with good fences and good stock tanks. Near Olden. 
491 acres in Eastland County with nice brick home, some coastal, 

fenced and cross fenced. Approximately 1/2  minerals. Shown by 
appointment only. 

486 acres near Lake Leon with 2 bedroom home, irrigation, and 
good fences, on pavement. 

695 acres in Eastland County with some river bottom, $315.00 per 
acre. 

306 acres near Eastland on Leon River with 106 acres coastal, 
bermuda and remaining improved grasses, ample irrigation. 
Water and equipment for all of tract. 7 stock tanks, pecan trees, 
good fences, metal corrals and a 40 x 72, all - steel barn, also other 
out - buildings. 

I

Bill's Camera Repair 
Cameras - Projectors 
Strobes - Light Meters 

4301 South 5th 
Abilene, Texas 79602 

Ph 692 - 7418 

WANTED- - Immediate 
positions available for director 
of nursing. LVN for 3 - 11 shift 
and relief 4 days a week. 

Also have available positions 
for cooks and nurses aides. 

For interview phone Twilite 
Acre Nursing Home, 817 - 643 -
2681. 11- 3tc 

REAL ESTATE 
65 A. on Hwy, 36, new tank, 40 

pecans, $375.00 per A. 

FOR SALE- 100 Ton Choice 
alfalfa hay. Truck load lots out 
of our barn. Ph. 806-266-5251, 

MeDermett, Morton, Tx. 
13-21p 

HAULING 
Sand, caliche and gravel 

R.D. Creech 
Phone 643-3613 

55 A. more or less, pavement, 
peanuts, well fenced, some 

love grass, $375.00 per A. 
- - - 

74 A. extra nice land, part sub 
irrigated, love grass, coastal, 

30 new land. 

S • 40- • -...-.4100--411-• - 

•••••• 	 - 	- • 

HEARING AID 

1 Beaune 11(1 Sale,  and 
a  ice ;Intl 	nn o all 

SALES AND SERVICE 

brands. John W climate 
fiox 1206. Cisco, Texas. 
442 2168. 

aill•c:••••••••••••••••••••,•••• 

5-tfe 
FOR SALE - - Westinghouse 
rotisserie like new. See Charlie 
Tyler. 13 3tc HELP WANTED- - Home 

workers needed in this area to 
lace leather goods at home. 
Earn $150 per week. No ex-
perience necessary. Send $1.00 
(refundable) and long stamped 
envelope to: 

Cumberland Leather Craft 

Political 

Announcements 

138 A. - - 11 (eleven) acres, 
35 cultivation, good buy, only 
$235.00 A. 

Listings Appreciated 
COGBURN REALTY 
893 - 6666 or 893 - 5895 

DeLeon 

We have qualified buyers 
for land in this area. If you 
are interested in buying or 
selling 	contact 	us 	at 
anylitne. 

Jimmy Partin 

Insurance 

And Realty Co. 
3434 North 6th St 

office Phone 673 - 2371 

‘ Ivo' liackfeld 	692 - 9597 
1 enita Raymond 	692 - 5244 

SMALL HOME REPAIRS 
Reasonable rates for car- 
pentry, patios, curbing, 
etc. 	No job 	too 	small. 
442.1370 after 6 p.m. J.B. 
Reed. 	2 mos. 

CROSS PLAINS 
ROOFING SERVICE. 

Residential & commercial. 
All work 	guaranteed. 	Ph. 
725 - 7686. 	8 - 3 mos. p. 

1516 Magic View Drive 
Kingsport, Ind. 37660 

11 - 3tp 

POLITICAL CALENDAR 
The following persons have 

authorized this newspaper to 
announce their candidacy for 
political office: 

- - - 
cONSTABLE PRECINCT 3 

E.N1. (Buddy) Turner 
N.D. Chancellor 
Hamp Komegay 

COUNTY COMMISSIONER 
PRECINCT 3 

1..7'. Owen - Re - election 
Johnny Ingram 

STATE SENATOR 
Toni Creighton- - re- election 

4 - tfc 

FOR SALE - - 2 bedroom 
home, carpeted, built - in 
range and oven, 2 large lots, 
barn, greenhouse and fruit 
trees. $10,500. 846 Willis, 1 block 
from NURSING HOME. Phone 
817 - 643 - 4121 after 4:00 p.m. 
weekdays. All day on 
weekends. 4 - tfc 

WANTED 
Red Fox--S1.00 each 

Snakes-51.00 a ft. some 
varieties. 

Collared Lizard-51.0O each. 
Terrapins-51.00 each. 

Ph. 81 7-725-7350 
Higginbottom 

Box 291 
Cross Plains. Tex. 76443 

1 2•8tp 

you're whistling 
in the dark. 

. if you haver, t had your 
blood pressure checked 
lately. You could have high 
blood pressure'and not 
know it. It can lead to 
stroke. heart and kidney 
failure. See your doctor•-
only he ran tell FOR SALE - - Bermuda grass 

sprigs dug daily. Phone 643 - 
3137. R.L. (Rob) Rust. 2- tfc 

WANTED- Have FHA loan to 
buy. Want 100-350A in East-
land County within 10 miles of 
Rising Star Phone 725-6466 
1 3 - 2 t p 

Give Heart Fund (-t 
Arnec.rar Hell? AsSOC , 31[0n COl'NT1' SHERIFF 

Ronnie (11.11,i %White 
.1olin Nlorren 

FOR SALE - - So. Main SI., 
two bedroom home; one bath; 
kitchen - dining room com-
bination; soacimis den; single 
car garagv- with large storage 
room; plenty of closets; big lot 
with garden space. 

- • - 
FOR SALE • - The place you 

have been looking for to build 
your retirement home. 50 acres 
with 25 acres coastal, all in 
cultivation. Good sandy: loam 
soil; I - 40GPM water well: 
good fences; small barn; one 
inile from downtown Rising 
Star. 

GREGORY 
PLUMBING CO. 
629-2753 

if Res. 639-2340 

Louis Hollywood 

Benny Moseley 

STATE REPRESENTATIVE 
54th DISTRICT 

JOE C. HANNA are-election). 
Couttlry Store 

FOR SALE 
524 A ranch and farm 

land, 21 2  miles NW of 
Rising Star; 1 2  mineral 
rights; approx. $4,000 year 
oil income; about 140 A. in 
cultivation, rest in grazing 
land; old house. Now under 
lease; all fenced, good 
roads. One of the better 
pieces of land near Rising 
Star. See Tom B. Stark or 
Archie Chamness, 
Realtors, Cisco, Texas, Ph. 
(817) 442 - 1144. 8 - 4tc 

Ruth Berry Pumps 

24 oz. Loaf Super Value Bread 

1 lb. Fresh Tomatoes 	 49c 

Bob Vaught 

)) 
White and Elna authorized 
sewing machine dealer. 
Repair all kinds, by factory 
trained mechanic. DAVIS 
FABRICS, 610 W. 2nd, 
Cisco. tfc 

	39` TAX ASSESSOR -
COLLECTOR 

Mrs. Nancy Trout 

[re-election) 

) oz. Ludens Cough Syrup 	..65` 

300 Count Asprin 	 .65` 

- - - 
FOR RENT--rural 3 bedroom 
home. 15 miles east of Rising 
Star. 51(10 per month. 12-11c 

Louis A. Mayfield 
Ph. 617 - 613 - -1973 

Associate to 
Dim .101111S011 Realtor 
Ph. 915 - 6-16 - 1317. 

STATE SENATOR 
22nd DISTRICT 
Toni Creighton LOBO BARBER 

STYLE CENTER 
709 Ave. D., Cisco 
Men and Women's 
Professional Hair 

Cutting and Styling 
Custom Hairpieces and 

Roffler & R K Products. 
Call 442-9979 

S 

S 

S 

May, Texas Phone: 259-2323 
S 

S 

S 

FOR SALE• 1968 Chcv. Bel-air. 
Ideal family car: clean. wellkept 
condition. Phone 6 43-25 71 

I 3 - 3 t ACCIDENT 
omme 

2705 MAR 74 M P. 34 

8 - tic 

FOR SALE--House to he moved 
3 bedroom. fully carpeted. 
except kitchen. Den, dining 
room, kitchen combination is 
paneled. Built-in oven and 
range in kitchen. Phone 81 7-64 3 
-3947. 12-2tp 

FOR LEASE 1 ' zt ' 12 A 
peanut allotment in Comanche 
County. 1000 lb. yield. Burford 
Carr Phone 81 7•64 3-41 72 13-1te 

Refrigeration And 
Appliance Service 
STEVE BIBLE 

Behind the hospital on West 
Mills Street, Rising Star. 10 I have some 20 tracts of 

land-from 2 Acres up to 1282. in 
a radus of 40 miles of Rising 
Star. Also have some residential 
property in Rising Star. Pro-
perty shown by appointment 
only Some of these farms priced 
below the high mark. Phone 
6 4 3-6 0 2 1 

FOR SALE - - Coon hound 
pups. Phone 643 - 3426. it - tic 

Carpenter, [build), remodel 
and repair). Consultation, 
estimates, financing, gua-
ranteed, references. 24 
hour service. Richard J. 
Cottrell, phone 259.2721, 
Box 143, May, Texas. 
12.4tp 

2916 MAR'74 M.P. 37 
FOR SALE - - Coastal Ber-
muda Sprigging. Ph. 643 - 3532. 
B.F. Dudley. Rising Star. 
Texas. 11 - tfc 

Be Secure ...With 
Complete Coverage 

We don't like to think about 

accidents and possible injuries on 

the farm. But they may happen 

even on the safest of farms. 

Protect yourself with insur-

ance that covers hospitalization 

• offers good compensation. 

GARAGE SALE- Big seven 
family garage sale, furniture. 
clothes, dishes, pictures and 
other miscellanious items. Sale 
starts Thursday, March 25 
through Saturday March 27. 
Open each morning at 9:00- 284 
W. 11th St. Cross Plains 

ff-111NE. 	NE.E.E.MEE. 

B & S Auto Parts 
• C B Radios 8: Accessories 
• Tape Decks 
• We Have A Complete Line Of 

Auto Parts And Accessories. 
• Lawn Mower Repair And 

Service 

John W. Bishop 
Owner - Manager 

FOR SALE- '69 Pontiac. 4 door 
sedan. Radio, heater and air. 
Phone 	6 4 3-3 7 I 3. 

FOR SALE-Five Browder hog 
feeders, 4,000 lb capacity. in 
good condition. Write Clovis 
McCary, Quail, Texas 79251, or 
call 80 6-4 4 7-5 6 34. or contact 
H.R. McCary May, Texas 13-2 
tp 	  

We Have Other Listings 
Large and Small 

All Listings Will be Appreciated. 
See Us for Details 

R.L. Buckley 
Insurance Agency 

3 4 4 2 1 

RODGER TERRELL 
Home 629 - 2896  

Office Phone 629- 1725 

Ifiway 80 East 
Eastland. Texas 

M.L. TERRELL 
Home 629 - 2443 

FOR QUICK SALE--Three bed- 
room home. on West Pioneer. 
Cecil Besscnt Phone 643-2642 
13tfc 	  

PAT MAYNARD 
Home 629 - 8063 



"This energy shortage is nothing new 
around our house." 

There is no energy shortage when you bank with 

FIRST STATE BANK 
Our employees are energetic and courteous when you 
come in to transact your business. Our services make 
banking easier for you. 

FIRST STATE 
BANK 

Member F.D.I.C. 

Rising Star, Texas 

PARKING • DRIVE-IN BANKING 
EXCELLENCE IN BANKING 

If\ 

' 	--4 	• .';‘'41 
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First Baptist 
Church 

Christian-Money Vows Read 
In Double Ring Ceremony 

Methodist 
Women Hear 

Mission Study 
Linda Christian, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Christian 
and Jackie Monsey were united 
in marriage on Friday, March 
5, at 6 o'clock in the First 
Baptist Church. 

The Rev. Dick Williams 
performed the double - ring 
ceremony. The bride, given in 
marriage by her father, wore a 
white satin dress. The chapel 
length train was accented with 
lace, trimmed tiered veil ex-
tended from the bridal hat. The 
bride carried a bouquet of 
yellow roses. 

Sharon Moore was the Maid 
of Honor. She was attired in 
yellow and carried yellow 
roses. David Williams was the 
best man from Abilene. Mrs. 
Pat Walker played the wedding 
music. 

Ina Mae Lamb, 81, died at 
Twilite Acres Nursing Home in 
Rising Star at 5:15 a.m. Friday, 
March 12, 1976. Services were 
held March 13. at 1:30 p.m. in 
Higginbotham Funeral Home 
Chapel. A nephew, Charles 
Lindley, Church of Christ 
minister in Bolan, officiated, 
and was assisted by Everett R. 
Hutchinson Sr. Burial was in 
the Alameda Cemetery south of 
Ranger. 

Born May 7, 1894, near 
Desdemona in Comanche 
County, she was reared in 
Eastland County. She was the 
eldest daughter of Charles M. 
and 	Sallie Schmick Prestidge. 
She married Andrew J. Lamb 
October 27, 1927, in the home of 
her parents north of Gorman. 
He preceded her in death 
August 16. 1973. She was a 
member of the Church of Christ 
for 69 years. 

Survivors include one son, 
William Charles Lamb of 
Clyde; one daughter, Mrs. 
Sallie Dell Hutchinson of Rising 
Star; three sisters, Mrs. Bessie 
Allison and Mrs. Charlott 
Lindley of Abilene and Mrs. 
Ethel Clack of Kilgore; five 
grandchildren and three great 
- grandchildren. She was 
preceded in death by two 
sisters and three brothers. 

Mrs. Lamb was a grand-
daughter of two pioneer 
families, Ike P. and Mary 
Hickey Schmick, James H. and 
Caroline Henry Prestidge, who 
settled in the Alameda Com-
munity in the late 1860's. These 
ancestors helped lay out the 
town of Eastland. Three of the 
Schmicks were the first to be 
public officials of Eastland 
County  

Help your 
Heart... 
Help your 
Heart Fund 

RUTHIE WILSON 

The United Methodist Women 
of the First United Methodist 
Church met Monday afternoon 
in the youth room for the 
mission study with 12 present. 

Mrs. W.C. Witt, president, 
presided. The opening song was 
"Open My Eyes That I May 
See", with Miss Elizabeth 
Robertson, pianist and Mrs. 
Cecil Joyce leading. Mrs. Bob 
Smith led the prapyer. Mrs. 
W.C. Witt reviewed the 5th 
chapter of the Mission Study on 
"A Nation Yet to Be". 
"America's Destiny" and 
"Judgment of God on Nations". 
Mrs. John J. Joyce read 
scriptures from the second 
chapter of Judges, the 10th and 
15th verses and the 24th chapter 
of Chronicles, verses 18 and 19. 

Mrs. James Armstrong had 
the topics of realism and 
spiritual challenge. Miss 
Elizabeth Robertson played the 
song, "I Am Praying For You" 
and each present prayed a 
silent prayer for the sick and 
shut - ins as the closing 
benediction. 

it has been said that people 
are like books in that their 
thoughts and deeds are written 
in their lives. It is good for a 
book to have a good title, but 
more important that the con-
tents of the hook be good. 
Likewise, it is good for a person 
to make a good appearance, but 
it is more important 'to live a 
worthy life. 

The christian has many aids 
in living that worthy life. One is 
the guidance given by God's 
word, the Bible. The Book of 
Proverbs has much to say 
about our living a worthy life. 

"He who gains wisdom loves 
his own life; he who maintains 
insight finds success". (19:8). 

"Every man is right in his 
own eyes, but the Lord weighs 
hearts. 	To 	practice 
righteousness and justice is 
more acceptable to the Lord 
than sacrifice." (21:2 - 3). By 
prayer and meditation on His 
Word we gain insight into the 
ways of the Lord and what is 
acceptable to Him 

"A relaxed mind makes for 
physical health; but passion is 
rottenness to the hones." 
(14:30). We live in a world of 
people all tied up in knots, full 
of anxieties and frustrations. 
How can one relax? "Trust in 
the Lord with all your heart and 
lean not on your own un-
derstanding; in all thy ways 
acknowledge Him, and He will 
direct your paths. Be not wise 
in your own eyes; revere the 

Wilson-Andrews 
Engagement 
Announced 

Lord and depart from evil; it 
will be healing to your body and 
nourishment to your bones." 
(3:5 - 71. 

In 	our associations with 
other people, much direction is 
given as, "Do not associate 
with one given to anger, and 
with a wrathful man do not 
keep company, lest you learn 
his ways and get yourself in a 
snare." (22:24) 

All of the above quotations 
are from the Berkely Version. 
The Book of Proverbs has much 
practical advice about every 
day living. Read a chapter each 
day and much wisdom will 
come to you as God's leader-
ship is given for your life. 

Sunday morning the pastor 
will speak on the subject, 
"Broken Vows". In the evening 
service the church will continue 
the study of Paul's letter to the 
Ephesians. The message, "The 
Oneness of the Body of Christ, 
the Church", will be the theme 
of the study of chapter two. 

R.D. Williams, Pastor 
Mr. and Mrs. Cal Wilson of 

Imperial announce the 
engagement and forthcoming 
marriage of their daughter, 
Mary Ruth to Allen Andrews. 
He is the son of Mrs. Lee An-
drews of San Angelo and the 
late Mr. Andrews. 

The wedding ceremony is 
planned for June 5, at 3 p.m. in 
the Imperial Community 
Center. 

Miss Wilson is a graduate of 
Rising Star High School and 
attended Ranger Junior 
College. Her fiance was 
graduated from Big Lake High 
School and Southwest Texas 
State University. He is a 
teacher and coach in Buena 
Vista School District in Im-
perial. 

MRS. JACKIE MONSEY 
...nee Linda Christian Thursday, 

March 25, 1976 

Following the ceremony, a 
reception was held in the 
church. The bride's table was 
laid with a white tablecloth 
trimmed with lace, and 
carrying out the bride's colors 
of yellow and white. 

The two - tiered wedding 
cake was white with yellow. 
roses and was topped with a 
bride and groom. Punch was 
served by Mrs. Willie Van-
divere, Mrs. Barker, Mrs. 
Jerrilyn Joyce and Sharon 
Moore. 

After 
Mexico, 

Services Here 

For Mrs. Lamb 

May Churches Plan 

Mission Program 

The bride is a 1974 graduate 
of Rising Star and the groom is 
a graduate of Cross Plains. 

a wedding trip to 
they will reside in 

Cross Plains. They are both 
employed at the Nursing Home 
in Rising Star. 

The Women's Missionary 
Unions of Calvary Baptist and 
the First Baptist Churches of 
May will host a film showing 
Saturday, March 27, at 7:00 
p.m. at the First Baptist 
Church. 

Dan Burt, Missionary in 
Brazil, will show films and 
speak on missions. 

Following the program, 
refreshments will be served. 
The public is invited to attend. 

MARCH 25 

Laura Louise Hokett 
Joe Crisp 

MARCH 26 
Jamie Long 

MARCH 27 
Bill Dennard 
Mrs. Slim Harding 
Micki Henderson 
Shirley Parker 
Brenda Nelson 

MARCH 28 
Woodrow Harris 
E.A. McBeth 
James Armstrong 
Waymon Ware 
C.R. Hart 
K. Joyce 

MARCH 29 
Velma Owen 
Goldene Ware 
Vonnie Ware 
Gene Hill 
Thelma Ford 
Kenneth Morrison 

MARCH 30 
Joe Martin 
Tom Grisham 
Denise Lipps 
Jimmy Christian 
Fred Price 

MARCH :ti 
Ted Herring 
Kevin Rust 
Debbie Green 

To Be Honored 
Friends and relatives are 

cordially invited to attend a 
wedding shower for Mr. and 
Mrs. Ricky Schaffer on 
Saturday, March 27, from 3:00 
to 4:30 p.m. in the Community 
Room of the First State Bank. 

Calling out-of-state? Save 
money by dialing the "one-plus" 
way. Calls after 5 PM Monday 
through Friday are discounted 
35 )̀/0...Calls after 1 1 PM, all day 
Saturday and Sunday 'till 5 PM 
are discounted a whopping 60%. 
Minimum rates now apply to 
one minute calls. These buys 
are yours for the dialing even if 
your area does not yet 
have direct dialing. 

••• 

"say hello 
to our 
good buy" 

I Am Pleased 

T)  To Announce 

Two Additions To Our Staff; 

Connie Sue Bond And 

Mona Wilson. 

These Along With Susie Bailey 
And Myself Are Happy To 

Serve You. 

Best Opposit of Show- Paula 
Eaves 
Specials Awards 
Eastland Auction Co. Awards 
for Showmanship 
Market Steers- Jimmy 
Thompson 
Market Lambs- Jpani White 
Market Hogs- Kevin Weekes 
Eastland County Farm Burea 
Awards of Showmanship) 
Breeding Beef Cattle- Revise 
Laminack 
Breeding Dairy Cattle- David 
Good 
Breeding Sheep- Craig Starr 
Breeding Goats- Billy Hitt 
Breeding Swine- Jeff Ripley 
Eastland County Farmers 
Union Herdsman Awards 
Dairy- Gorman 
Sheep- Cisco 
Beef- Cisco 
Swine- Ranger 
Mike Farnsworth Memorial 
Trophy- 
Cattle 	Company Steer 
Trophy- Neil Scott 
Ferguson Time Show Most 
Cooperative Showman Award-
Randy Laminack 

Stock Show... 
(Con't. from page 1) 

8th- Gary Jackson, Gorman 
FFA 
9th- Johnny McCaghren, 
Nimrod 4- H 
10th- 	Dale 	Spurlen- 
Eastland 4- H 
Hereford Bulls 
Champion Hereford- Scott 
Hoover, Ranger FFA 
Reserve Champion Hereford- 
John Hoover •, Ranger FFA 
IHereford Heifers.  
Class 5 
1st- Renae Smith, Gorman 4- 
h 
Class 6 
1st- Terry Jeffs 
2nd- Randy Laminack, Gor- 
man FFA 
3rd Revise Laminack, Gorman 
Ffa 
4th Tim Bint, Cisco FFA 
Cwass 7 
1st- Revise Lammick 
Class 8 
1st Randy Laminack 
Champion Hereford heifer- 
Terrye Jeffs 
Reserve Champion Hereford 
Heifer Randy Laminack 
Angus Bulls 
Champion Angus- Brenda 
Kidd, Eastland 4- H 
Angus Heifers 
Class 17 
1st- Brad Fortune 
2nd- Sherry Kidd, Eastland 
FFA 
Class 18 
1st- Terrye Jeffs 
Class 19 
1st- Kevin Winnett, Cisco FFA 
Class 20 
1st Bud Jeffs 
2nd Keith Winnett 
Champion Angus heifer- Brad 
Fortune 
Reserve 'Champion Angus 
heifer- Terrye Jeffs 
All other breeds 
Champion- Tommy Dunham 
Reserve Champion- Scott 
Mauney, Gorman 4- H 
Grand Champion Bull- Scott 
Hoover 
Reserve Grand Champion 
Bull- John Hoover 
(rand Chu mpii on 	eller- 
Terrye Jeffs 
Reserve Grand Champion 
Heifer- Brad Jortune 
4- 11 Rabbit Show 
Colored Bucks 
1st- Paula Eaves, Gorman 
2nd- Eddy Gibson, Eastland 
3rd- ,lo Anne Gibson, East-
land. 
4th Dale Spurleo, Eastland 
51h- Vicki Brown, Gorman 
61h- 	Beverly U nderwood, 
Gorman 
7th- Kim Rodgers. Carbon 
Colored Does 
1st- Paula Eaves 
2nd- Jo Are Gibson 
3rd- Vicki Brown 
41h- Kevin Johnfon 
5th- Dale Spurlen 
6th- Dale 
7 th- Jonna Rodgers 
White 
Ist- Jo Anne Gibson 
2nd- Philip Wealherley- Cisco 
Best Rabbit of Show- Paula 
Eaves 

• CContinental Telephone of Texas 

Connie's Beauty Salon 
Phone 643-4673 

Connie Hightower - Prop. 

A Theft Policy 

0 

2907 JULY'74 M.P. 31 

Sure You're Insured 
To Replace Losses? 

Bad as it is to be burgled, 
it's worse to discover too 
late ... that your coverage 

wasn't adequate. Call 
for an update ... US 

Jenkins 
Isurance Agency 
Phone 817-643-2251 

Rising Star, Texas 



BY MRS. JACK MILLWEE 

Pioneer News 
-Mrs. A.C. Halsell 

	• 

Sipe Springs 
News 

S 

S GORDON SPOT 
by DeMarquis Gordon 

Take a vacation 
from summer heat! 
Plan ahead...Big selection of models 
to choose from! 

We can add it, or replace 
it. The most efficient way. 
Payne Central Air Condi-
tioning. Made to keep 
operating costs down. The 
cool way. 

FREE ESTIMATE 
SALES, 

INSTALLATION 
AND SERVICE 1±trancklicilng 

Call...or come by 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
RISING STAR, TEXAS 

Kaieidtpwrope of fired 

I trqiniel .4 /haw t .• 

I 	N.... 14 

Your Vote And Influence In The 

Coming Election Will Be 

Appreciated 

• 
M. 

•••••••• 
• 

N.D. Chancellor 

Candidate For Constable 

Precinct 3, Eastland County 

Heart 
Disease. 
You can 
live 
without it. 
Give ATh 
Heartl ) 
Fund _ 
American Heart Association 

Thursday, Mardi 25, 1976 

Wildcat Tales 
Sponsor .. 	 Mrs 	Linda Burns 
Editor 	 Peggy Perry 

May News 
Entha Campbell Kincaid's 

Real Estate Corner 
Ass't. Editor 	 

Sr. Reporter Ready For Everything Mr. and Mrs. Milton Dukes of 
Rising Star visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Graham. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Mc-
Daniel, Timmy and Heather of 
Levelland visited their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Marion J. Mc-
Daniel last weekend, 

Mr. and Mrs. John 
McKeehan visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Tankersley in Midland. 

Susan Walker 
Susan Walker 

Jr. Reporter - Today, Not Tomorrow 	Tricia Jones' 
Soph. Reporter • In Search of the Future 	Jenny Walker 
Freshman Reporter - In the Fishbowl   	Kim Harris 
FFA Reporter -With the Farmhands.... ..Doddie Chambers 
FHA 	Reporter -Toward New Horizons.... Randie Bradley 
Annual Staff Reporter • A Yearbook Never Forgets . Pam Hill 
Cheerleader Reporter - All the Way Big Blue .Kathy Wilson 
Boys Sports -Wildcat Country 	Ken Hounsel 
Girls Sports - LC's Goldfingers 	 KCD Rutherford 
Band Reporter -Do Re Mi 	 Nancy Medford 
Library Reporter • With the Bookworms ........Beth Wallace 
Reporter - at - large - Galloping Gossip 	Clark Smit 

HOUSES 
:1 bedroom frame home, living room, dining room, kitchen, 

utility area with washer, dryer, bath, newly panelled throughout, 
single car garage and storage, corner lot, offered completely 
furnished, new Spanish style living room suite with hide - abed, 
color TV, dining room furniture, Spanish style bedroom suite, one 
brass bed and chest, one set twin beds, stove, refrigerator and 
other misc. items, all included at the price of $11,200.00. 

Large 3 bedroom frame, large living and dining room com-
bination, bath, garage, pecan trees, garden spot, large lot, 
located 115 Scurry St., Gorman. $10,500.00. Consider Terms. 

LAKE PROPERTY 

Mrs. Opal Fleming and Mrs. 
Grace Glenn attended a 
musical and singing in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Leonard 
Norris at Pioneer Thursday. 

Mrs. Vina Mae Johnston's 
sisters from Lubbock and 
Pittsburg visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Johnston. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. George 

Leonard, Terry Leonard, and 
Johnny Childress spent the 
weekend on the Colorado River. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Helmuth 

and boys of Gorman visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Jeff Price. 

While reading a book of 
inspiration this week. I ran on to 
the following quotation from 
Thomas Dekker. I hope you like 
it. "To awaken each morning 
with a smile brightening my 
face; to greet the day with 
reverence for the opportunities 
it contains, to approach my 
work with a clean mind; to hold 
ever before me, even in the 
doing of little things, the 
Ultimate Purpose toward which 
I am Working; to meet men and 
women with laughter on my 
lips, and love in my heart; to be 
gentle, kind and courteous 
through all the hours; to 
approach the night with wear-
iness that ever woos sleep and 
the joy that comes from work 
well done--this is how 1 desire to 
waste wisely, my days." 

event to notify any of the many 
seniors. 

Susan 

Mr. and Mrs. N.L. Leonard 
and Ruby Boswell visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack McKeehan in 
Brownwood. 

Mrs. Nora Shirley reports 
that her son-in-law, Robert 
Carlisle is in the Veteran's 
Hospital in Dallas, where is 
undergoing treatments. 

Mrs. Ray Todd of Hereford 
and Mrs. O.B. Chambers of 
Brownwood spent the afternoon 
with Mrs. Grace Glenn and Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Woods and 
son Glenn Saturday. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Brutton 

played 42 with Mrs. Grace 
Glenn and Mrs. Opal Fleming 
Wednesday night. 

- - • 
Mr. and Mrs. Warren Devers 

of Amarillo spent the weekend 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee Devers. 

Mr. and Mrs. G.P. Whittle 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Losten 
Bennett and Mr. and Mrs. 
Wilbert Shaw at Abilene. 

Rev. and Mrs. Armo Bentley, 
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Moore, 
Fred Ashworth, Dutch Mon-
tgomery, also Jeanetta and 
Teresa Lawrence, Dorothy 
Bishop went to the Comanche 
Associational Singing at First 
Baptist Church at Sidney. 

The Gospel Singing at Mr. 
and Mrs. Leonard Norris's 
home. Thursday night was well 
attended and enjoyed by about 
fifty guests from Pioneer, 
Rising Star, May, Cross Plains, 
Santa Anna and Eastland. 
Among the good singers and 
pianists were Mrs. Ruby Jo 
Webb Lewis of Eastland, Mrs. 
Grace Morrison and Kenneth of 
Rising Star and Mrs. Kate 
Watson of Cross Plains. 

Dear Sis, 
Here is an Italian cake recipe 

that you got from Ima Crooks. 
Cream after each addition: 2 C. 
Sugar, 1 stick oleo, 1 2 c. Crisco 
oil, 5 egg yolks, (whites last), 
add 2 C. Flour and 1 cup but-
termilk with 1 tsp. soda, 
alternately. Add and stir 1 cup 
angel flake coconut and 1 cup 
finely cut pecans. Beat the 5 
egg whites and add 1 tsp. 
vanilla to the whites, then fold 
into cake batter. Bake in Bundt 
pan for one hour or 9 x 12 x 2 for 
45 minutes or until done. Ice or 
leave plain. 

- - - 
Here is a good yeast bread 

recipe that is easy, delicious 
and convenient. Add 1 pkg. dry 
yeast to 1 cup warm water, put 
6 cups flour in large mixing 
bowl, 1 2  c. sugar, 2 tsp. baking 
powder, 12  tsp. soda, 1, 2  tsp. 
salt. Mix 2 cups buttermilk, , 2 

cup cooking oil and stir in water 
and yeast, mix with dry 
ingredients. Refrigerate until 
ready to cook, then remove 
from refrigerator and let rise 
1,2  hours, then bake. 

If you remove from 
refrigerator and bake im-
mediately, it will taste like sour 
dough bread - - allow to warm 
and rise 11 2 hours, it is very 
light. 

TODAY, NOT TOMORROW 
As graduation time nears, all 

of the juniors are wondering if 
they can make it for one more 
year. Plans are underway for 
theJunior - Senior Banquet. As 
far as school goes, it is the 
same as usual. (That is, when 
we happen to have class$) 
Everyone is counting the days 
until spring vacation. After this 
year, we will have only one 
more year. HOORAY!!! 

That's it for this week, 
Tricia 

Mrs. Georgie Leonard and 
Mrs. Jo Nell Leonard of Gor-
man visited Mr. and Mrs. N.L. 
Leonard. 

- - - 
Mrs. Ricky Huddleston and 

Mrs. Joyce Burk of Comanche 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Wyatt. 

Mr. and Mrs. N.L. Leonard 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Everett 
Harris in Rising Star. 

The Calvary Baptist Church 
will have the Rev. James 
Brandon of Clarendon April 23, 
24, and 25, to do the preaching 
at 7:30 p.m. Friday and 
Saturday and the morning and 
evening services on Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Fleming 
went to Rowena Saturday. to 
visit her mother, Mrs. Mat-
thews, who is staying with 
another daughter at this time. 

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Mabra Sunday 
were their son, Mr. Alven 
Mabra, Dennis and Larry of 
Fort Worth. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Lancaster 
returned home last Sunday 
from a five day visit with Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Fortune and 
Chris. They also visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Jelly Matlock in 
Corpus Christi. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Morris 

Peterson, Scott and Stephanie 
of Hillsboro, Mr. and Mrs. 
David McDaniel of Austin, and There were eighteen regular 

members present at the Quil-
ting Club last Tuesday. Those 
visiting were Mrs. Lou Odder 
and Mrs. Gail Flippin's child-
ren. Regular game night at the 
Club House will be Thursday 
night March 25. Visitors are 
always welcome. 

NOTES FROM ALL OVER 
By golly, the Brain has done 

it again (with a lot of help from 
my mom)!! I finally figured 
out just why there is such a 
flood of diamond rings and 
things among the girls. Take a 
close look at your calendar, 
especially February. See that 
lonely little 29 in the corner? 
That means it's Leap Year! 
That fourth year when girls can 
take the initiative and do the 
proposing themselves. ( No 
wonder my mom has been 
making such broad hints! Just 
kidding, boys, so don't look so 
worried.) Not that it has much 
impact today, what with 
Women's 1.ib and everything. 

I noticed that one of the 
reporters remarked that it was 
not very exciting around here 
at the moment. Exciting, no, 
hectic, yes. Just ask Mrs. 
Diddle. Thursday here's an 
HECE Banquet, the week after 
the FHA Banquet, a chance of 
having two important visitors, 
etc., etc. Friday track meets 
are giving Mr. F. ulcers since 
they leave hardly enough 
students to make keeping the 
school open worthwhile. 
Seniors are doing their plan-
ning for the immediate future, 
mainly graduation and college 
plans. Book reports and 
English notebooks are due, and 
worst of all, sitting there 
watching the sunshine (and 
whatever else kind of weather) 
and wishing you were out there 
with it. In short, spring fever. 

Sickeningly yours, 
Mahal 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Millwee, 
Edward and Margaret visited 
over the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Layne Cotter of Baird, 
Mr. and Mrs. Windell Hines of 
Monte Vista, Colo.; Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Kanady of Baird; 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Taylor of 
Tahoka and Mrs. M.D. Leslie of 
DeLeon at the Baird Lake. 

- - - 
Visitors in the Luther 

Franklin home have been Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee Moore of Fort 
Worth and Jack Taylor of 
Sidney. 

SENIOR NEWS 
Well, graduatiortIS Slab' 

becoming a reality for all 
seniors. We received our in-
vitations this week so many of 
you will recognize those little 
white envelopes as they begin 
dropping in your mail boxes. 
There are very many last 
minute details that the seniors 
are now faced with. With pen in 
hand each senior is addressing 
their invitations and licking 
those stamps, 13c apiece. What 
ever happened to the good old 
10c days?? 

Preparations are now being 
made for the 144tle Miss Rising 
Star Pageant which this year is 
taking on the theme of "The 
Wizard of Oz. The date set for 
this important event is April 12, 
at 7:00. We would like for each 
mother who would be in-
terested in letting her children 
participate in this spectacular 

16, 2  acres Possum Kingdom, 2200 ft. frontage, 6 lodges: Main 
lodge 2775 sq. ft. (2) 1352 sq, ft., (3) 1944 sq. ft. (4) 1640 sq. ft. (5) 
1144 sq. ft., (6) 1066 sq. ft. Recreation bldg. 3600 sq. ft. All com-
pletely furnished, own water system, butane system, sewer 
system, boat dock boat launching ramp, all in good repair. For 
Sale or Trade. 

2-1 acres of land Lake Leon, over 1400 ft. water frontage, road 
frontage on 3 sides, needs a developer. $24000.00. 

100 acres. 3 4 mile water frontage with 30 acres irrigated from 
wells. 1 4  mile highway frontage, pecans, deer and quail hunting, 
excellent building site. $350.00 per acre. 

260 acres approx. 11, miles water front, good house, out 
buildings, :1 4  mile highway frontage, pecans, 35 ac. cult. an ex-
cellent buy at $325.00 per acre. 

SMALL TRACTS OF' LAND 
3,2  acres highway frontage, trees, good building site, $2000.00. 
12 acres all coastal, 4 irrigation wells, outskirts of Anson. Also 

has hog sheds and farrowing set up, completely fenced and cross 
fenced with hog wire, will G.1. $12000.00. 

25 acres, creek bottom land, highway frontage, good tank 
$10000.00. 

63,2  acres of land, secluded and rough, good grass, improved 
varieties sown, no minerals, good tank, excellent deer and bird 
hunting :1 4  mile off pavement, 6 miles from town. $300.00 per acre. 
Terms available, would consider GI. plus cash. 

Two 44 acre tracts that adjoin, tank water on both, highway 
frontage, not far out, good open grass land with scattered trees, 
city water possible. $16000.00 each tract. G.I. 

101 acres good improved native pasture, close in, some trees, 
some creek bottom, net fences, 2 good tanks, good deer and bird 
hunting. City water possible. $375.00 per acre. Terms. 

70 acres coastal, good net wire fences, 2 pastures, well, tank, 
barns, close in. $400.00 per acre. City water possible. 

40 acres coastal, close in, good fences, $400 per acre. Will take 
G.I. plus cash. City water possible. 

36 acres brush land, close in, city water, excellent location, 
$14,000.00. Will G.1. 

107 acres, good fences, barns, south of Carbon, 2 tanks, one 
well, 85 percent minerals, $350.00 per acre 

i35 acres n.w. rising Star, several good water wells, some 
orchard, good peanut allotment, asking $350.00 per acre, make us 
an offer. On pavement. Financing available. 

FARMS AND RANCHES 
237 acres, excellent grass land, scattered clumps of live oaks, 

good highway frontage and excellent location, 2 tanks, city water 
possible, $350.00 per acre, good terms can be arranged. 

320 acres, highway frontage, 60 ac. cultivation, now in K.R. 
bluestem, creek, well, 4 tanks, good net wire fences, excellent 
terms can be arranged. $325.00 per acre. 

HID acres improved ranch, nice house, barns, corrals, several 
pastures and traps, 3 wells, 8 tanks, 2 springs, good location, on 
pavement, good bird and deer hunting, fish in tanks, good net 
fences. $350.00 per acre. Excellent terms. 

1000 acres good grass land, 2 wells, 8 tanks, good net fences, no 
bldgs., pavement, good location, $300.00 per acre. Excellent 
terms. 

650 acres rolling, semi open grass land, some bottom and river 
frontage, good fishing in river, pecans, several good tanks, 1 
water well, 40 ac. coastal, 25 acres grain, excellent deer hunting, 
air strip, net wire fences, 2 houses, 35 miles from city limits Fort 
Worth $350.00 per acre, excellent terms. 16 percent down balance 
to be arranged 8, 2 percent interest. 

1068 acres highly improved ranch located on Paluxy River, 
welded pipe corrals, landing strip and hangar, good barns, ex-
ceptionally nice 3500 sq. ft. home, 3 other houses, 80 acres coastal, 
45 acres grain, excellent fishing, deer and bird hunting, 50 miles 
from downtown Fort Worth. $600.00 per acre. Excellent terms. 15 
percent down, balance to be arranged 8 percent interest. 

Fruit growers are watching 
the weather forecasts and 
hoping that there are no more 
hard freezes,. We didn't think 
the fruit had been damaged by 
the light freeze, but Tommy 
Rice, manager of the Smith 
Fruit Farm at Carbon, called to 
report a 75 percent kill of fruit 
by the freeze. Mrs. Stan 
Weekes, whose husband owns 
the Freeman Orchard near 
Ranger, said she didn't think 
they had received much 
damage. Mrs. Weekes said the 
temperature had dropped to 28 
degrees, but only for a short 
period. 

Those visiting with Mr. and 
Mrs. Beggs this week•end were 
Mrs. Jack Thomas, Sabanno; 
Mrs. Bromfield,,, Cross;  Ptah-4s; 
Billy Zirkle, Rising .Star; Miss 

Irigram, CottenwOod; 
Mrs. Sonny Smith. Abilene; 
Rev. Milton, Cross Plains; and 
Mr. Clifford Buchannon, Ft. 
Worth. 

will be busy trying to memorize 
the lines of their play and that 
should take up most of their 
time. 

IN SEARCH OF 
A FUTURE 

Not much excitement has 
happened this week. The play is 
going better. We don't get to 
use our books - - EEK! 
Congratulations to Kim and 
Theresa for winning the essay 
contest last week. 

The play is set for March 25, 
at 7:00 in the gym. Admissions 
are $2 for adults and $1 for 
students. The sophomores are 
really going to be busy this 
month. 

In English we finished 
Caesar and then we had to 
memorize 45 lines. J.C. found 
an easy way to do it until Mrs. 
B. found out. J.C., was that 
really fair? Physical Science 
keeps us busy with ex-
periments. Our notebooks are 
due this week, remember? 
Homemaking girls are learning 
all about houses. Last week we 
learned from a film how to give 
artificial respiration. We've 
been busy with March of Dimes 
and the Heart Fund. Coming up 
in April is the Walk - a - thon. I 
hope everyone will help us out. 
We will walk 21 miles. The Ag. 
II boys are still welding. In 
World History we finished a 
chapter on Indians. The track 
team is doing fine. The first 
meet was a little scary, though, 
and we miss L.H. and G.W. 
hope you're a lot better very 
soon! 

Smile 
(since school's soon out) 

Jenny 

Many of us are already 
talking about the things we'll do 
this summer, like getting 
suntans, making money, and 
buying new cars. It will be 
more likely that we'll end up 
with blistered shoulders, empty 
pockets, and a broken - down 
bike. But then if we had 
everything we wouldn't be able 
to dream. 

Bye, 
Kim IN TILE FISH BOWL 

Another week at R.S.H.S.; 
seven more and we'll be out of 
the fish bowl and rid of our 
seniors. t Yea! ) 

We don't have to worry about 
the sophomores this week: they 

Mrs. Pauline Champion and 
son Champ. and Lynn Hutton, 
Mrs. Homer Parson's brother 
all went onn a picnic with the 
Homer Parson's family, Sunday 
evening. Mr. and Mrs. Steven 
Guyn of Blytheville Arkansas 
spent last week with Mr. and 
Mrs. Truitt Parson. Their 
children, who were visiting 
also, are William and Tina 
Guynn. Mr. and Mrs. Cowan 
Hutton took his mother, Mrs. 
J.T. Hutton of Shallowwater, 
and Mrs. Delma Dean of Cross 
Plains to Ballinger to visit 
friends and relatives, recently. 

Whatsoever you would laugh 
at in others, laugh at in 
yourself. 

Mrs. Lucy Townsend of 
Arkansas, is visiting her sister 
Mrs. Sooter this week. 

We have for sale or trade large ranches, irrigated farms, all 
sizes anywhere in the Southwest. Also motels, office buildings, 
shopping centers, commercial property of all types. Contact us 
for whatever you need. 

ROBERT M. KINCAID REAL ESTATE 
too South Sea man 	 Eastland. Texas 

629 - 1781 
Robert M. Kincaid Night Phone 629- 2815 

Areas which have been in sod 
for over two years, that have 
had the same crops every year, 
or areas that have ! large 
amounts of organic matter are 
most susceptible to soil insects. 

It's important to use the right 
kind of insecticide on your 
garden. Many insecticides may 
be harmful to certain 
vegetables and only a few can 
be used safely. 

Diazion and chlordane are 
two commonly used in-
secticides that are safe for 
gardens. However, root crops 
should not be planted in soil 
treated with chlordane. 

Apply the insecticide about 
two to four weeks before the 
garden is to be planted. Work 
the insecticide into the top four 
to six inches of soil and make 
sure it is evenly distributed. 

To cover 1,000 square feet of 
soil with diazinon, use six fluid 
ounces of 25 percent 
emulsifiable concentrate. Mix 
it with enough water to cover 
the entire soil area. If you use 
powder use 12  cup of 50 percent 
wettable powder mixed with 
adequate water. To cover 1,000 
square feet of garden area with 
chlordane, use two fluid ounces 
of 72 percent emulsifiable 
concentrate mixed with water 
or 3 4 cup of 40 percent wettable 
powder mixed with water. 

The 1976 Eastland County 
Livestock Show ended Satur-
day. We would like to thank all 
the people who helped with the 
show, and all those who sup-
ported the show with donations 
of money, time and supplies. 

- - - 
Before planting your 

vegetable garden this year, 
take precautions against 
harmful insects. 

Wireworms, white grubs, 
mole crickets, cutworms, flea 
beetle larvae, fly larvae and 
maggots are among the insects 
that feed on the seed, roots and 
other underground parts of 
vegetables. 

Mrs. A.C. Halsell went to 
Llano Friday to accompany her 
brother and wife to Austin. 
where he entered Sewn Hospi-
tal for treatments. She reports 
that he responded to the 
treatments well, and will 
possibly get to return home 
soon. 

LILLIAN'S BEAUTY SHOP 
IS OPEN FOR BUSINESS -- 

EASTER SPECIAL 
'18.50 Permanent for 	250 

Reduced Prices On Other Permanents 

LILLIAN'S BEAUTY SHOP 
PHONE 643-3091 

Mr. Eugene Gibson and son 
Gene Jr. of Brownwood visited 
his mother one day last week. 
Gene Jr. remained for a longer 
visit. He has returned home. 

Eastland County Law 
Enforcement Banquet 
Set For April 16 

Farmer's Union Sets 

Gorman Meeting 

Eastland, 	second 	vice 
president; Louis Hollywood, 
secretary - treasurer; and 
directors Kenneth Rose, DPS: 
Ray Whiggington; Truitt Grice 
and Van Perryman of Ranger. 

The Eastland County Far-
mers Union will hold a meeting 
on Thursday night. March 25. at 
the Farmers Peanut Co. 
building in Gorman at 7:30 p.m. 
All members are urged to at-
tend. 

Available At 

Tickets will go on sale Friday 
for Eastland County Law 
Enforcement Appreciation 
Banquet VI, Association 
President Judge Scott Bailey 
has announced. 

In charge of ticket sales are 
the following: Gorman. Mayor 
Check Smith and Chief Albert 
White: Rising Star. Mayor 
C.M. Carroll and Chief Truitt 
Grice; Cisco, Mayor John 
Webb and Chief Raymond 
Wiggington; Ranger, Mayor 
Max Anderson and Chief Red 
Rose; in Eastland Mayor H.V. 
O'Brien and Chief John 
Morren; and Sheriff L.E. 
Sublett of the County Sheriff's 
Dept. 

Tickets are $4.50 each for the 
7 p.m. event which will be held 
at the Siebert Elementary 
school, catered by Vance 
Godby. 

Chief Morren is program 
chairman. 

Association officers are in 
addition to Judge Bailey: 
Laverle Ames of Ranger, vice 
president; Sgt, Ben Sancillo of 

The Rising Star 

V,47•-14, 	400.3re. -47-:Cfrsialar.WAVASECS:evs: 



CH DAD DE RISING STAR 

For City Council ( Pirra .1I Osmium del Consejo Municipal ) 

Vote for 2 (Vote por 2) 

❑ WALTER RICH BURG 

❑ JOHN W. LEE 

0 JOHN \IcCUISTION 

Seperate Insurance Required For C.B. Radios Whodunit? 
dealer started advertising that 
he would give away free CB 
radios with the purchase of a 
new car. 

Apparently no one is exempt. 
A Fort Worth Assistant District 
Attorney had his CB radio 
stolen, as did the mayor pro tern 
of SanAntonio. Secretary of 
State Mark White, and Texas 
Insurance Commissioner Joe 
Hawkins. 

The problem became so 
severe late last year that the 
State Board of Insurance 
excluded CB radios from the 
standard comprehensive cover-
age portion of an automobile 
policy. (This exclusion also 
applies to two-way mobile 
radios or telephones, including 
accessories, equipment and 
antennas.) 

If CBs had been left under 
that coverage, ''there is no 
telling what it would have done 
to comprehensive rates," a 
board official recently told 
members of the Texas House 
Insurance Committee. "We 
may have saved a major 
comprehensive rate increase," 
he said. 

While some CB owners object 
to having to pay additional 
premiums, insurnce industry 
representatives say it is not 
right for the non-CB owner to 
face higher rates because of the 
CB boom. 

The new ruling, which 
applies only to policies sold 
after January 1, means that 
unless the vehicle owner pur-
chases coverage specifically for 
his CB, it will not be protected 
on his insurance policy. 

Equipment valued up to $750 
may be insured for $17 per year. 
For $751-$1500 in coverage, it 
would cost S27. For equipment 
worth more than $1500. it is 
$53. Rates are set by the State 
Board of Insurance, which will 
review them periodically when 
there is additional statistical 
evidence. 

These coverages may also be 
purchased under a different line 
of insurance, though the rates 
are generally higher. 

Portable units that are moved 
from one car to another can be 
insured by a separate policy. 
Even if the radio is not insured, 
any damage done directly to an 
automobile by a thief comes 
under the standard comprehen-
sive coverage of the policy. 

A "hit" by a thief takes less 
time than it took for the owner 
of the CB to make the first 
payment. Typically, a thief goes 
to a large public function such 
as a basketball game looking for 
cars in the parking lot which 
sport a CB antenna. 

It might take two and half 
minutes to open a locked car. 
Once in the car, the thief uses a 
bolt cutter and screw driver to 
remove the unit. At home the 
serial number, which is often 
pasted on, will be removed and 
unit sold to a "fence". 

The Texas Automobile Insura 
nce Service Office says there 
are several ways to protect your 
property. 

-First, record the serial 
number and date and place of 
purchase of CB equipment and 
keep the information with other 
valuables. 

-Second, use an electric 
engraving tool or any sharp 
object to inscribe some identi-
fying mark (such as a social 
security of driver's license 
number) on the back of the 
radio. Also, scratch your initials 
in some secret corner of the 
unit. The only way the police 
can return a stolen unit to you is 
if you are able to identify it 
properly. 

- Third, if you park your car in 
a public place. remove the 
antenna and unit (if possible) 
and lock them in the trunk of 
take them with you. 

- Fourth. buy CB equipment 
only from a franchised or 
reputable dealer. If it can be 
proven that you knew a unit was 
stolen when you bought it, you 
can be convicted as an 

(ED. NOTE: Copied from 
Education Service Center 
Newscene. This is a news 
service for Region 14 of Texas. 
It covers a very large portion of 
Central Texas. To get a review 
like this is a very special honor 
for both teacher and class.) 

Nowi the time 
to call your 

air conditioning 
serviceman. 

radio has increased, there has 
been a corresponding increase 
in theft of CB equipment. 

During 1975, more than half a 
million dollars worth of CB 
radios were stolen in Dallas 
alone, and during one seven 
month period there were 1.638 
reported CB thefts. 

Houston law enforcement 
officials say they average 20 to 
30 reports of stolen CBs a day. 
In Corpus Christi, the number 
of reports of CB thefts jumped 
dramatically when a local car 

"Breaker, breaker one-nine. 
Pig pen, this here's the Rubber 
Duck... Come on." 

So go the lyrics from a 
popular record which glorifies 
one of America's newest fads--
citizens band (CB) radios. 

No where is the tad more 
popular than in Texas where an 
estimated 206,000 CB operators 
chatter away on the 23 channels 
authorized by the Federal 
Communications Commission 
for citizens broadcasts. 

As the popularity of the CB 

WHODUNIT? 
Bobby Fortune's civics class 

at Rising Star didn't know, but 
they planned to find out. 

Because of the quarter 
system, civics has now become 
a two - quarter course. For-
tune, who is also the high school 
principal, taught the first 
quarter strictly by the text-
book. Ennui set in; the students 
became restless and bored. 
Following a discussion of the 
problem, teacher and class 
decided a project would liven 
things up, particularly if the 
project were a murder trial. 
The result was an exciting 
learning experience with total 
class participation. 

The class created the cir-
cumstances. They didn't want a 
clear cut case, but did want to 
see if they could present it well 
enough for a jury to reach a 
verdict. Into the story went the 
typical triangle, business 
partners in disagreement, nosy 
neighbors, a sympathetic bar 
girl - - enough circumstancial 
evidence for an arrest. But 
would there be enough evidence 
for a conviction? 

Much research went into 
developing the case. One of the 
students consulted a lawyer 
about legal terminology. As a 
class the students looked up 
points of law. Law books as well 
as the textbook were studied. 
All classroom discussion was 
taped, then played back in 
order that mistakes might be 
found and corrected. A judge, 
prosecuting attorney were 
chosen. Written into the story 
was a role for each member of 
the c class. Pertinent points of 
information which must come 
out in the trial were decided 
upon for each character; after 
that he would be allowed to ad 
lib. 

The jury selection followed 
real life procedure which the 
class had studied. Six juniors 
and six sophomores made up 
the jury panel. 

Whodunit really isn't im-
portant, although one can't help 
but wonder what the jury 
found. The enthusiasm of the 
students was infectious. Cer-
tainly Bobby Fortune's civics 
class has learned more and will 
remember longer about justice 
and the legal process than if 
their education had been 
confined to the textbook. 

(Get a checkup before the heat's on.) 

SPECIALS AT 
rrayaniiis 
wby Evelyn Wheat 

CISCO, TEXAS 

Monday Night: Fried Catfish Buffet 
To the Clown" (left to right) Cast of "Goodbye 

Bruce Williams, Darla Bosch, Pam Hill, 
Craig Campbell and Susan Walker. 

ALL YOU CAN EAT Smith, Clark 
4 Tuesday Night: Mexican Food Buffet 

ALL YOU CAN EAT 

Wednesday Night: Fried Chicken 
FINGER LICKEN' FRIED CHICKEN 

Thursday Night: Bar-B-Que Beef 
PIT COOKED 

Friday Night: Rib Eye Steak 
SALAD BAR 

Salad Bar 
Friday-Saturday-Sunday Nights 

U.I.L. Play Presented March 29 
Campbell, Dr. Benson - -
principal of the school - -
Bruce Williams and Miss 
Erwin - - Peggy's teacher - -
Pam Hill. 

The program will also 
feature the Prose and Poetry 
events as follows: Prose 
Reading - - Susan Walker, 
Peggy Perry, Kim Harris and 
alternate, Derenda Lawrence; 
Poetry Interpretation - -
Sharon McGinnis, Beth 
Wallace, Randa Bradley and 
alternate, Janetta Lawrence. 

Right now your air conditioning serviceman 

can easily work your call into his schedule and 

get your unit ready to deliver dependable 

cooling through the summer ahead. 

The U.I.L. One- Act play and 
Literary Events will be 
presented Monday, March 29, 
in the High School Gym at 7:30 
p.m. This program will feature 
the One Act Play "Good - bye 
to the Clown". 

The cast includes: Peggy - -
a nine year old girl with an 
imagination - - Darla Bosch, 
Clown - - a make believe friend 
of Peggy's - - Clark Smith, 
Mother - - Peggy's mother - -
Susan Walker, Uncle George-
- Peggy's Uncle - - Craig 

We know that many people wait until the heat's 

on to install electric air conditioning or have their 

units serviced. Later on, your dealer or serviceman 

may have a waiting list. Phony As A $2 Bill? 
--- Not Anymore 

WTU wants you to get the greatest value 

from your electric service. One way we can help 

is to remind you to get the junto on summer 

by calling your serviceman early. 
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Pick up you FREE copy of 

"ENERGY CONSERVATION" 

Booklet from 

[Li Fkigidaire •  

After a 10 year absence, $2 
bills are returning as official 
currency. On April 13, in 
commemoration of Thomas 
Jefferson's birthday and in 
conjunction with the bicen-
tennial year, the Federal 
Reserve System will make 
available at commercial banks 
a new series 1976 $2 Federal 
Reserve note. 

Like all $2 bills since 1918, the 
note Features Mr. Jefferson on 
the face of the plate. The 
reverse plate, however, is 
completely new. It shows a 
vignette based on John 
Trumbull's famous post -
Revolutionary War painting, 
"The Signing of the Declaration 
of Independence", capturing a 
bicentennial theme and tying in 
with Jefferson, author of the 
document. 

Although issued in con-
junction with the Bicentennial, 
the new $2 bill is seen as a 
permanent addition to 

Home Environment Division of General Motors. 

currency in circulation. In 
announcing the reissue last 
November, Treasury Secretary 
William Simon said public 
acceptance would ensure the 
issue's success. 

The Treasury withdrew $2 
bills from circulation in 1966, 
largely because their relative 
scarcity dampened public 
acceptance. About six million 
$2 bills - - only a third of one 
percent of the Nation's out-
standing currency - - were 
circulating in 1966. 

By contrast, about 225 million 
notes will be available on April 
13. And about 400 million notes 
- - the projected average 
annual production - - will be 
circulating by July 4. 

The new $2 note is expected to 
reduce the huge volume of $1 
notes in circulation, producing 
savings of about $30 million to 
the Treasury Department and 
the Federal Reserve System 
over the next five years. 

WestTexas Utilities 
Company An bid 

OW thinly I 

Remember REDDY Supplies the energy—

but only YOU can use it wisely! 

citizenship. 
"If you've lost your social 

security card, you can get a 
duplicate by contacting any 
social security office," 
Hammons said. "You can get a 
duplicate faster if you've kept 
the stub that came with your 
original social security card." 

The Abilene social security 
office is at 142 South Pioneer 
Drive. The phone number is 698 
- 1360. 

Please support MARCH OF DIMES 

mot ers 
ma 	on birth defects 

Help Raise The 
Flag 

0 N N€2 	0 0 NO 
0 NO 

April 3, 1976 
3 de abril de 1976 

Rising Star Independent 
School District 

School Trustee Election 
ElecciOn pars Regentes 

Escolares del Distrito Escolar 
Independiente de Rising Star 

Note: Voter's signature to he affixed 
on the reverse side. 

Nola: Firma del votante debe ser 
fijuda al lade reverso. 

OFFICIAL BALLOT 
April 3, 1976 

3 de abril de 1976 

City of Rising Star 
City Officer Election 

Ciudad de Rising Star 
Eleccion pare Oficial de la 

Ciudad 
Note: Voter's signature to be affixed 

on the reverse side. 
Note: Firma del votante debe ser 

Slade al lade reverse. 

OFFICIAL BALLOT 
Vote for the candidate of your choice in 
each race by placing an "X' in the square 
beside the candidate's name. 

Vote for the candidate of tour choice in 
each race by placing an "X' in the square 
beside the candidate's name. 

BOLETA OFICIAL BOLETA OFICIAL 
Vote por el candidate de su preferencia en 
cada candidature marcandu con "X" en el 
cuadro Junto al nombre del candidate. 

Vote por el candidate de su preferencia en 
cada candidatura marcando con "X" en el 
cuadrn junto al nombre del candidato. 

xxxxxxxx 
Wouldn't You Like To Be A Part Of 

America's Bicentennial Celebration In 

Putting Copies Of This Important 

Document Into The Hands Of All 

Who Need To Know Our Story In 

Flags? 
• 

Wouldn't It Be Great To Have This 

Book In Your Public And School 

Libraries? You Can Help. • • 

CITY 
RISING STAR INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 

DISTRITO ESCOLAR 1NDEPENDIENTE 
DE RISING STAR 

OF RISING STAR 

- PASS THE FLAG BOOK - 

For School Trustees — Vote for 2 

Para Regentes Escolares—Vote por 2 

O R. L. (BOB) RUST 

n BERNIE BARNES 

O DAVID HARRIS 

n WOODROW HARRIS 

1 to 5 copies 
$1.00 each 

10 to 100 copies 
80c each 

6 to 10 copies 
90c each 

100 to 200 copies 
75c each 

FLAG BOOK 
P.O. Box 29 
Eastland, Texas 76448 

NAME 	  

ADDRESS 	  

CITY 	 STATE 	 ZIP 	 

POST PAID 

Write For 
Volume 
Prices As 
Low As 25c 

Apply Now For 
SS Number 

For Summer Jobs 
Housewives. students, and 

other people who plan to get a 
summer job should apply now 
for a social security number if 
they don't have one. according 
to Glyn Hammons, social 
security district manager in 
Abilene. 

"You should apply for your 
number several weeks before 
you need it for a job covered by 
social security", Hammons 
said. "Applications must be 
screened against central files 
in Baltimore to make sure that 
a second number isn't issued to 
that same person. Screening 
generally takes three to six 
weeks." 

People can get information 
about applying for a social 
security number by calling, 
writing, or visiting any social 
security office. People applying 
fora social security number for 
the first time may be asked to 
prove their age, identity, and 



OM ES fin 02 PM AK ea HP MI re Aine 
251 
35` 
55` 
131 

2 Bags 

Each 

Each 

CARROTS.  

ITEOBORANT SOAP 
He Chiffon Spill-Mate 

PAPER TOWELS 
Top Kick 

DOG FOOD Canned Can 

POTATOES 	Russet 	lb. 	15` 
'DETERGENT 	King Size 	 $1 75 

I.G. BREAD 	1/2  lb. Loaf 	 35`1 
EGGS 	Dozen 	 65c 

Majestic Theatre 
Eastland 629-1220 

THURS.-FRI.-SAT. 7:30 P.M. 

THAT OLD BLOODSUCKER 
IS BACK 

and this time he's biting off 
more than he can chew! 

IF YOU LIKED 
"YOUNG FRANKENSTEIN" 

YOU'LL LOVE 
"OLD DRACULA' 

A  Woo Id I din StiViAt, PI ad MI ion • An American International Release 

VID NIVEN is"OLD DRACULA" 
with TERESA GRAVES 

JENNIE LINDEN • NICKY HENSON 
PETER BAYLISS 

SAT. 8 SUN. MATINEE '2 P.M. ONLY 

PatAlAIINT menusmum A ROBERT B. RAD9172 macros 

c.211Y Side 
of the 

el/fountain 

An 
unbelievale 
adventure! 
A boy 
conquers 
the 
wilderness 
with only 
a raccoon 
and a 
falcon 
to help him! 

riDDY•ECCLES -ra-nd THEODORE BIKEL • 
umsosTED91ERDEMAN JANE MOVE on JOANN A CRAW FORD 

itARK.PANAVNIASP.ITIAHNIMIIIR• A PARAWSIINT  	I "Ai 
e.t.a.:um was Ismilif ornis vane • moss ROBFJ1111 RADNITZ 

SUN.-MON-TUES. 
warren beatty 

Julie Christie • goldie hewn  

from Columbia Pictures 
A P•Billsta Feature 
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) COMMUNITY NEWS 

Mr. and Mrs. Donald R. 
Jones of Brownwood, Mr. and 
Mrs. Spencer Liles and Connile 
of Abilene, Mr. and Mrs. Clint 
Keys, Anne and Shane of 
Midland were weekend visitors 
of Dow and Opal Jones. 

'T'rutrfl. Mrs. Jackie Tischler, Natalie 
and Jason went to Rochester to 
celebrate her mother's bir-
thday last Tuesday. Her 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. J.D. 
Holmes. 

- - - 
Mrs. Annie Thompson and 

Mrs. Mary Rhoads of Bangs 
visited in the Community last 
Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Stark and 
sister of Cisco, visited Mr. and 
Mrs. M.J. Dukes Monday af-
ternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Price Dennis of 
Wichita Falls and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ed Terrell of Brownwood were 
weekend visitors of Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Novak. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Alford 

and little son, Chan, of 
Comanche visited Mr. and Mrs. 
W.E, Caudle Sunday. 

• - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Alford and 

son Jim, Greta Isbell and Judy 
Goodwin all of Sweeney, Debra 
and Amanda Tunnel' of DeLeon 
were weekend guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Giles Lockhart and 
Mr. and Mrs. W.E. Caudle. 

• - - 
Debbie Nunnally, a student at 

the University of Houston, 
visited her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Nunnally over the 
weekend. 

• - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Danny Hughes 

and little daughter of Fort 
Worth, spent the weekend in the 
home of his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lee Hughes. 

- - - 
Mrs. Charlie Chamberlain is 

a patient in Eastland Memorial 
Hospital. 

- - - 
W.E. Fussell visited friends 

at Corpus Christi and Rockport 
last week. 

- - 
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Jones and 

children of. Garland were 
weekend visitors of Mr. and 
Mrs. Mearlyn Jones. 

- • - 
Mrs. Vada Arnold entered 

West Texas Medical Center 
Tuesday noon, where she will 
undergo tests and treatment. 

- - - 
Mrs. Lola White who un-

derwent surgery recently in 
Santa Anna Hospital, has 
returned home and is 
recovering nicely. 

Left top row (1) Grady Owen, (2) Beulah (Hilton) 
Sadler, (3) Marshall Hughes, (4) Hallie (Owen) 
Acker, (5) Lula (Holbrook) Stegall, (6) Francis 
Holbrook, (7) Della (Morgan) Reed), (8) Myrtle 
(Adams) House, (9) Bertie Brown, (10) Sallie 
Trawick, (11) Vista (Hilton ) Court. Second Row: 
(1) Rosette (Morgan) Gage, (2) Earl Fussell, (3) 
Jessie Holbrook, (4) Earnest Vannoy, (5) Mary 
(Fussell) Crisp, (6) Jessie Brown, (7) Cordie (Grant) 

Wolf, (8) Effie Clement, (9) Addle Grant, (10) Sidney 
Hord, (11) Ethel (Fussell) Alexander. Third Row: (1) 
? Hord, (2) Edgar Fussell, (3) Alvin Hord, (4) Eura 
Trawick, (5) Mary (Owen) Marsh, (6) Johnnie 
Trawick, (7) Lonnie (Morgan) Cawley, (8) Ethel 
Trawick, (9) Visitor. Left Window: Spergeon 
Clements. Teacher: Lula Holbrook - - HALLMARK 
SCHOOL 1907 and 1908 

HAVE SOMETHING TO SELL? 
TRY A CLASSIFIED Riding Club Open ICA Head Pushes Legislation 

Play Day Mardi 28 Vital To Landowners 

Welcome back Barbara Lee, 
and our new cook Lucille 
Engle. To the staff at Twilite 
Acre Nursing Home. 

We enjoyed a party Friday. 
Celebrating birthdays of Mattie 
Knight and Mabel Smith. St. 
Patrick favors set the dining 
room tables. Mrs. Helen 
Switzer and Denece Hubbard 
helped with serving. Music by 
Gertrude Courhvright. 

- - - 
We play a lot of dominoes and 

42. Thursday evening we had 
four tables playing. Mr. Earl 
Fussell comes and plays with 
Jet Millwee, Birdie Medford, 
Buster Rixford, Mary Ham-
mitt, Ethel Deggman, Martha 
Irby, Bessie Rachel, Thurman 
Garner, Doodle McDaniels, and 
Mary Hord. 

- - - 
Visiting Mary Hammitt and 

Martha Irby was LaVerne 
Barnes of Fort Worth 

• - - 
Mrs. Alice Griffin had a 

weekend out with her grandson 
Mark and other family 
members. 

- • - 
Mr. Hank Wilson visited in 

the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Clinton Wilson. 

• - 
Visiting Newman Jones was 

his daughter, June Moore of 
Abilene and Ellie Elliott. 

- - - 
Mrs. Sybil Roark visited her 

sister, Mrs. Mabel Smith, and 
visited Maggie Groce, Emma 
West and Eva West. 

- - - 
Visiting Beatrice Hellums 

was her daughters and 
relatives. 

Visiting with George 
Williams was his daughter, 
Heide. Hattie Williams and 
Mrs. Elvin Shearrow of 
Browinvoad. 

- - - 
Visiting Edna Barnes was 

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Ragle of 
Graham. 

- - - 
Visiting Maggie Grace and 

Emma West were Mr. and Mrs. 
C.P. Hines and Denise of 
Odessa. 

• - - 
Visiting Bet Millwee was Ted 

and Mark Barton of Sipe 

Springs, June Moore of 
Abilene, Mrs. Westerman and 
Luann Campbell, her grand-
daughter of Abilene. 

- - - 
Visiting Millie Clark and 

Josie Hammonds were Elsie 
Criswell, Ellie Elliott, Mr. and 
Mrs. Albert Clark and Bill 
Crawford. 

- - - 
Visiting Lessie Claborn and 

Johnie Weathersby were Mr. 
and Mrs. Red Huddnall, Ellie 
Elliott and Lee Weathersby. 

Visiting Ethel Barnes were 
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Barnes of 
Fort Worth and Jean Witt of 
City. 

- - 
Visiting with Hattie Boatman 

were Mrs. Carry Bucy, Elza 
Witt, Laura Eaker, Olena 
Ezell, Lolene Claborn, Thelma 
Shelton of Baird, Uva Mae 
Jones of Cottonwood, Flora 
Westerman and Ellie Elliott. 

▪ - - 
Visiting Ora White were Mr. 

and Mrs. Porter White of 
Amarillo, Thelma Doebner and 
Bessie Bowers of Brownwood. 

- - 
Visiting Loraine Williams 

was her son Steve Williams and 
Stevie of Clyde. 

- - - 
Visiting Berdie Medford were 

Bob and Liz Medford, Ellie 
Elliott and Cordie Wolfe. 

- - - 
Thanks again to everyone 

who has helped us out in any 
way. Elza Witt and Carrie Bucy 
brought helpful handicraft. We 
use things for prizes and 
handicrafts. We enjoy your 
visits. Words seem so small a 
way but we thank you. 

• - - 
It is great to see all the folks 

who come visiting at Twilite 
Acres. Bro. Owen Aikin and 
wife are such a delight to the 
residents. We see quite a lot of 
them. Thank you Bro. and Mrs. 
Aikin. 

- - - 
Somehow we missed out on 

our worship service this week, 
but next Sunday the service is 
by the Church of Christ. 

• - - 
Until next week, remember 

today is the first day of the rest 
of your life. 

Eastland County Rates Sixth 
In Rye Production 

WASHINGTON-- The head of 
the Independent Cattlemen's 
Association of Texas this week 
testified before congressional 
committees on the need for 
federal estate tax reform, 
reduction of foreign beef 
imports and upgrading of 
sanitation rules on imported 
meat which is sold in America. 

WA president, T.A. Cunn-
ingham of Golaid spent the 
week at the capitol pushing for 
passage of bills important to 
consumers, landowners and 
livestock producers of Texas. 

Cunningham addressed the 
powerful House Ways and 
Means Committee in behalf of 
raising the estate tax exemption 
from the 560,000 set in 1942 to 
"a more realistic" 5200,000 and 
warned that failure to do so 
could lead to takeover of the 
nation's agricultural lands by 
large corporate operations. 

9 t- 
	_ 	f• 

U.S. Sen. Lloyd Bentsen of 
Texas has introduced a Senate 
bill to increase the exemption. 

On the meat inspection bill, 
Cunningham told the Senate 
agriculture subcommittee that 
the American people have a 
right to expect imported meat to 
be subject to the same 
standards as domestic meat and 
that foreign meat should be 
clearly labeled as imported. 

Cunningham urged an over-
haul of beef import policies 
speaking to a subcommittee of 
the Senate Fimance Committee, 
saying that present import 
policies put the interests of 
foreign governments ahead of 
the well-being of American 
producers. 

The Grant Town Riding Club 
of Mingus, Texas, is having an 
Open Play Day, March 28, 1976, 
at 2:00 p.m. There will be five 
events: Barrels, Flags, Poles, 
Potato Race and Tunnel. This 
will be an all Trophy Playday 
and six places will be awarded 
in each event in four classes 
(Pee wee, Junior, Intermediate 
and Senior). 

Charge will be $1.00 each 
entry. Concession stand will be 
open. 

The Grant Town Riding Club 
has just completed their new 
arena in Mingus, located just 
south of the old gym, two blocks 
west of the Trii Club. 

We would appreciate your 
participation. In case it should 
rain, the Play Day will be held 
the following Sunday, April 4. If we do not pardon, we do 

not love. 

Graham Services 
For Father Of 
Tommie Pernell 
Monroe R. Pernell, 68, of 

Possum Kingdom Lake, passed 
away Thursday, March 18, in a 
Lubbock hospital. 

Services were held on 
Saturday at 2:00 p.m. in the 
Eastside Church of Christ in 
Graham. 

Clarence King, former 
pastor, officiated. 

Burial was in the Pioneer 

• Cemetery in Graham. 
Born 	April 30, 1907, in 

Comanche County, he had been 
a resident of Possum Kingdom 
since 1951. He married Katie 
Watts in 1944 in Abilene. He was 
a member of the Church of 
Christ 

Survivors include his wife; 
one daughter, Mrs. Steve 
Hudson Jr., of Lone Star; two 
sons, Jesse R. Pernell, of 
Dougherty and Tommie Gene 
Pernell of Rising Star; five 
grandchildren; nine great -
grandchildren: two brothers. 

county farmers harvested Ray of Van Horn, N.M., Clyde 
some 1.900 acres with an of Dickens; two sisters, Mrs 
average yield of 18.9 bushels Andy Phillips of Wichita Falls 
per acre. Statewide rye and Mrs. Ruby Edwards of 
production for 1975 was 760,000 Afton, Texas. 
bushels. 

AUSTIN - - With a total crop 
of 38,000 bushels, Eastland 
County placed sixth in- 1975 
Texas rye production. 

According ' to Agriculture 
Commissioner John C. While. ,) 

Churn 
ICE CREAM 	

$
a" ROUND STEAK 

MARGARINEtolo'reibi Cups 49` P  9 19  
Churn Gold 

Per lb. 
Large She 

GRAPEFRUIT 6 F°R$1® 
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TEXAS PRESS 
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HAMBURGER 

69` 

$109 
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SUGAR s Bag 
Krafts Tasty 
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Reg. Tall Cans SALMON 
18 oz. Glass 
APPLE JELLY 
Keebler Rich N Chips 

COOKIES 	Large Pkg. 
Fresh Country 

EGGS 
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Decker 

FRANKS 
12 oz. Pkg. 

69c 

Per Doz. 

Kknbell 
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Red Delicious 8 Winesap 
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DRINKS 	6 Cans $100 
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42 oz. 
 

$109 

Dankworth 
Pure Pori 

SAUSAGE 
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Per lb 
Our Prices Are Lower 

E.F. Agnew & Sons 
Rising Star's Favorite Food Store 

Since 1920 
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