
• 

Rising Star, Texas Number 12 Two Sections Established in 1890 Thursday, March 24, 1977 

Huddleston Moves Shoe Shop Phil Mitchell Breaks 
Own Record At Relays 

15c Plus 1 c Tax 

Request Made 
To Housing 

Authority Board 

Winners Announced 
Following Grand 

Opening At Cross 
Plains Auto Supply 

A request has been made by 
the Department of Housing and 
Urban Development to the 
Housing Authority Board of 
Rising Star that the city require 
individual meters to the local 
housing units. At the present 
time. there is only one master 
meter for the entire project. 
The City Council has received 
this information and will act on 
this request in the near future. 

S 

Jaycees 
Elect 

Officers 
Moving day- - Mr. Carver Iluddleston is 

pictured above in the process of moving his shoe 

repair business from Main Street to Highway 36 
(next to AY. Snit th's Barber Shop.) 

Winner of the Kodak EK- 6 Instania tic Camera 
given away in the Grand Opening of the Cross 
Plains Auto Supply was Mrs. W.O. Rachels. 
Pictured above is her husband, who was present 
at the drawing and accepted the prize. 

Rising Star residents will still 
be able to bring their broken 
and torn shoes and boots io be 
fixed-Carver 	Huddlcsmn, 
owner and operator of Star Shoe 
Shop has only moved to a new 
location. Only the location is not 
so new to Mr. Huddleston, 
some years ago the shop was 

In a drawing he Id Saturday 
afternoon at the grand opening 
of Cross Plains Auto Supply 
prizes were given away: Mrs. 
W.O. Rachels- - Camera; Bill 
Hendrick- - camera; 	Peggy 
Purvis- - carving 	knife; 
Roger Williams- - Rod and 
reel; Jim Brown- - Rod and 
reel; Pearl Burkett- - fishing 
rod- ; Pearl Burkett- fishing 
rod; Fred Coffey- - fishing 
rod; Sharon Donimy- - jacket; 
V.L. Hobdy- - jacket; Bobby 

I guess we ran all breathe a 
sigh of relief once more- - the 
expected freeze last night did 
no extensive damage to fruit 
trees or tender vegetation in 
the area, to my knowledge. 
Temperatures only remained 
below freezing for a short 
duration and no loss is 
estimated. Seems as though the 
mesquite trees missed their 
guess this year. With Easter 
being right around the corner, 
maybe our cold nights will be 
limited. 

Winfrey- - jacket; 	George 
Johnson- - jacket; Melvin G. 
Jackson- - jacket; T.S. 
Chambers- - jacket; and caps 
were given away to Jimmy 
Bates, Bubba McConal, Gloria 
Dominguez; Ceci I L. Belew, 
Darwin Pharr and G. M. Taff 
Jr. 

Ted and Mark would like to 
thank everyone who came out 
during the grand opening last 
week and hope you continue to 
patronize their automotive 
supply. 

Atwood Places 
Name In Ring 

Dennard Named To 
Dean's List 

.. ulal., k• 

Hounsel and Jami Long for 
their fine showing in the 
Eastland County Livestock 
Show this past weekend. Keep 
up the good work. 

The Rising Star Jaycees 
elected new officers for the year 
at their regular scheduled 
Thursday night meeting. Those 
who will serve are as follows: 
President: Randy Goldston; 
Internal Vice-President: Charlie 
Moore; 	 External 
Vice-President; Jim Williams; 
Secretary-Treasurer: Morris 
Delong; State Director: Scott 
Felker; and Directors: Bobby 
Burns and Tommy Pcrnell. 
Outgoing 	officers 	are: 

President: David Harris; 
Vice-President: David Pollock 
and Secretary--Treasurer: Ray 
Daniels. 
The annual Jaycee Banquet 

has been set for Thursday 
night, March 31st in the High 
School Gym. New officers will 
be installed at this event. 
Tickets will be available for 
53.00 each or 2 for $5.00 from 
any members of the local 
Jaycees. 

The local 
Jaycees have recently elected 
new officers and will have the 
installation of these people at 
the annual Jaycee Banquet to 
be held this year on March 31st 
in the High School gym. 

located in this building and later 
moved when he and his wife, 
Lucille occupied the building on 
Main Street together for sixteen 
years. 

The new location is on 
Highway 36 and is next door to 
A.P. Smith Barber Shop. 
Mr. Huddleston has worked in 

the business off and on since 
1931. after completing his 
service in the U.S. Army. 
Carver and Lucille were married 
on October 20. 1931. 
For a time. Mr. Huddleston 

leased the shoe shop from Mr. 
Martin and after the building 
burned, 	purchased 	the 
machinery located in the 
operation and thus began his 
career in the shoe business. 
Since July. 1948. Mr. 
Huddleston has pursued this 
one career. 

Sonic of his hobbies include 
fishing. gardening and he also 
has a rather unique hobby--he is 
a keeper of honey bees. 
Friends and customers are 

extended a cordial invitation to 
visit Mr. Huddleston in his new 
location. 

Nicky Newbury, Rising Star 
15.6; 5. Robert Solis, Br-
wonwood JV 16.1; 6. R. Brown, 
Hamlin 16.3. 

HIGH JUMP- I. Robert 
Gibson, Mozelle 6- 5 (New 

record, old record set 6- 4 by 
Maqrk Hardcastle, Early 1976). 
2. Jerry Newman, May 6- 0; 3. 
R. Brown, Hamlin 6- 0; 4, Jay 
Edwardsm May 5- 10; 5. James 
Halum, Brownwood 9th 5- 10; 
6. Saathoff, Goldthwaite, 5- 8. 

ion YARD DASH- 1. Phil 
Mitchell, May 10.3; 2. Lee, 
Hamlin 10:35; 3. Ken Hunter, 
Cross Plains 10:35; 3. Ken 
Collier, Goldthwaite 10.4; 5. 
Tomlinson, Hamlin 10:45; 6. 
Greer, Dublin 10.6. 

DISCUS1. Toby Hare, 
DeLeon. 127- 5: 2. Ronnie 
Oliver,rRule 119- 8; 3. Darrell 
Ethridge, Duboin 117- 3; 4. 
Wynn Byler, Bangs 116- 1'2; 5. 
Jagger Hico 114- 4; 6. Barthold, 
Brownwood JV 114- 242. 

440 YARD DASH1. Hal 
Needham, Hico 53.6; 2. 
Barrera, Hamlin 55.1; 3. Ken 
Hounsel, Rising Star 55.4; 4. 
Jeff Findley, Bangs 4 54.6; 5. 
Marty Shoemaker, DeLeon 
55.7; 6. McConal, Cross Plains 
656.1 

330YARD INT. HURDLES- 
1. John Lucas, Hico 43.5; 2. 
Johnny Allison, Bangs 43.7; 3. 
Maberry, Hamlin 44.2; 4. C. 
Brown, Hamlin 45.5; 5. Robert 
Solis, Brownwood JV 45.6; 6. 
Martinez CGoldthwaite 46.2. 

220- YARD 	DASH- 1. 
Charles Threet, Rule 22.9; 
(New record, old record 23.0by 
Mike Simon, Goldthwaite 
1974); 2. Thompson, Hamlin 
23.0; 3. Tommy Collier, Goldth-
waite 23.1; 4. Greet, Dublin 
23.7; 5. David McKamey, 
Bangs 23.8; 6. Robby McKin-
ney, Bangs 24.0. 

MILE RELAY- I. Rule 3:34.2 
(New record, old record 3:36.5 
by Bangs in 1974); 2. Bangs 
3:40.3;p 3. Hasmlin 3:1/23.7; 4. 
Hico, 3:44.6; 5. Rising Star 
3:45.6; 6. Early 3:46.1. 

TEAM TOTALS- Hamlin 99; 
2. Rule 73; 3. May 62; 4. Bangs 
43; 5. Mozelle 36; 6. Gold-
thwaite 28; 7. DeLeon 26; 8. 
Early 24; 9. Cross Plains 23; 10. 
Hico 22; 11. Rising Star 12; 12. 
Dublin 11; 13 Brownwood JV 8; 
14. Brownwood 9th 5. 

Food Stamp 
Workers Will 

No Longer 
Come To Area 

;Jodi' a\ t rage on the 4.fi  Cale 
for honor. 

Undergraduate 	courses 
only are conisdered in the 
tabulated list. 

Incomplete, or "I" grades 
earned during the fall 
semester, disqualifies students 
from the Honor Rolls. 

Dennard of Box 95 in Rising 
Star was on the regular Honor 
Roll. 

Ms. Mclnis of 306 W. Pat-
terson in Eastland also made 
the regular Honor Roll. 

1 

Read The Classifieds 

SAN MARCOS- - Donato 
Dennard of Rising Star and Sue 
Mclnis of Eastland were 
among the 3377 Southwest 
Texas State University 
students whose fall semester 
grades earned them places on 
the Dean's List. 

To make the regular Honor 
Roll, a student must be enrolled 
[Dr a minimum of 12 semester 
hours of coursework, excluding 
physical education activities, 

and achieve at least an overall 
"B" average. 

To make the Superior Honor 
Roll, requires grades of "A" in 
at least 12 of the required 15 
semester hours of coursework 
and no lower than a "B" in the 
other three- hour course. This 
translates into a 3.8 grade- 

Named All-State Team 

The Eastland Food Stamp 
Workers will no longer make 
monthly visits to Rising Star. 
Gorman. Ranger or Cisco. If 
you wish to request an 
application or report changes, 
please call 629-1772, or write 
P.O. Box 471, Eastland, Texas 
76448. The office is located on 
the third floor of the Eastland 
County Courthouse. If you are 
unable to come to the office, 
please call and the worker will 
make arragements to visit your 
home. 

Chamberlain Asks For Support 
In The April 2nd Election Results 

Announced Mr. And Mrs. 
From Golf Bob Shults 

Day 	To Travel 

The Rising Star track team is 
competing fast and furious this 
year in local meets. The 
Wildcat Relays are scheduled 
to be held in Rising Star this 
weekend. March 25th- - so all 
you parents and friends come 
and support these hard working 
youngsters. 

- - - 
A large turnout last Tuesday 

night for the First Annual 
Appreciation Fish Fry. 
sponsored by Winfrey Feed and 
Seed brought lots of com-
pliments to the chef for the 
evening. Following the meal, 
slides were shown and in-
formation given pertaining to 
various herbicides, fertilizers 
and products represented by 
£he following companies. Smith 
Douglas Fertilizer Co., Elanco. 
Mobil, and Nitragin Soil Im-
plant. A representative from 
the Gold- Kist Peanutc.impany 
of Comanche was also present 
and talked to the group 
stressing competitive 
production with other southern 
states. 

krips„ 4 
Roland Atwood 

I, Roland Atwood am a 
candidate for the position of 	.••••11 EMMEN'. ••• 
city councilman for the City of 
Rising Star. 

I was born and raised here Buchanan And Murdoch 
and also attended the Rising 
Star Public Schools. I have 
attended Cisco Junior College 
for two years. 
I have been in the oil field for 

the past twenty years. 
If elected,. I will do my 

utomost to uphold the honesty 
and integrity to the city and 
'work to the best of my ability to 
make the necessary local 
changes to meet our present 
and future econimic needs. 
I am in favor of good city 

government and allowing our 
city to grow. 

Your vote and support on 
April 2nd will be appreciated. 

Grandson Of 
Local People 
Doing Fine 

After Surgrey 
Bonnie Buchanan 

Results of the golf scramble 
held at Lakewood Recreation 
Center Sunday, March 20th are 
as follows: First Place--Holland. 
Hounsel and Garrett with 64; 
Second Place-McNeil, Oliver, 
Rankin and Jo Davee with 66; 
Third Place---Tie and the coin 
toss was won by Lou Grider, 
Hefley and Frances McAnnaly 
with 68; Third Place--losers of 
the toss: Loving. Bibb and 
Frankie Smith with 68. 

Charlie Chamberlain 

Karla Murdoch 
Rosemary Schulte, 5- 7 sr., 
Nazareth; Tracey Airhart, 5- 7, 
sr., Klondikep Cindy Kimbrow, 
5- 9, sr., Greenwood, 

SECOND TEAM 
Forwards- Sharla Jameson, 

5- 7, sr., Eola; Karen Schulte, 
5- 7, jr., Nazareth; Jeanene 
Bradford, 5- 6, jr., Kondike; 
Guards- Karla Murchoch, 5- 
10, sr., May; Tina Reich, 5- 4, 
sr., Crawford; Cidny Skeen, 5- 
6, jr., Follett. 

THIRD TEAM 
Forwards- Jill Floyd. 5- 9, 

soph., Sands; Patsy Roach, 5- 
7, sr., 	Follett; 	Louise 
Daughtery, 5- 6, sr., Brock. 
Guards- Janet Jurecek, 6- 0, 
fresh., Eola; Kay Sorrows, 5- 
11, sr., Axtell, Toni Bralley, 5-
8. sr., Groom. 

A number of people have 
asked for further information 
of the Day Care Center which 
opened in the southwest part of 
town a couple of months ago. I 
am sorry to report that the 
Center is no longer in operation 
and I know of no further 
developments with regard to 
someone else beginning 
operation in the near future. 

A sunrise Easter service is in 
the planning stages. Further 
information will be disclosed at 
a later date. 

Another star has been added 
to the already brimming crown 
of May's Bonnie Buchanan. In a 
release from the Amarillo 
Globe News, both Buchanan 
and Karla Murchch, out-
stan ling guard for the May 
Tigers, were named on the All-
State team, Class B, They were 
both named earlier to the all-
state tournament. 

The girls ended play in 
Austin, losing to Nazareth 73-
54 in the state finals. 

CLASS B 
FIRST TEAM 

Forwards- Bonnie 
Buchanan. 5- 10, sr., May; 
Kathy Westerfield 5- 7, sr., 
Crawford; Cheryl Hartman, 5- 
11, jr., Nazareth; Guards 8 

John Wesley Flippin, twelve 
year old grandson of Mr. and 
Mrs. Thomas Flippin who 
recently underwent open heart 
surgery in Children's Medical 
Center in Dallas, is reportedly 
doing great. 

Th e surgery which lasted 
from 8 a.m to 3 p.m. was the 
fourth operation for the youth. 
Doctors anticipate a normal 
life for the lad which include 
participation in a number of 
spoting events. John is ex-
pected to be released from the 
hospital later in the week and is 
eternally grateful for all the 
wonderful people who donated 
blood to be used during the 
surgery. 

News Deadline THE ARMY RESERVE. 
PART OF WHAT YOU EARN 

IS PRIDE. 

11:30 A.M. Tuesday 

should be now--not ten years 
form now. 
I have served this community 

for the -past 13 years, working 
in most all your homes as a 
plumber; I believe I have 
treated all with honesty and 
intergrity. 1 can serve you as 
city councilman with the same 
fairness. If I am elected, I will 
work to the best of my ability to 
serve and help the people of 
Rising Star. If we need to make 
changes to meet our future 
economy, then changes should 
be made. We must endeavor to 
grow and advande, for standing 
still means only deterioration. 
There are 1009 wonderful 

people in this city, so let's put 
our shoulders to the wheel, and 
start rolling. 
I will appreciate your vote on 

April 2, 1977. 
Charlie Chamberlain 

I, Charlie Chamberlain, am a 
candidate for councilman for the 
city of Rising Star. I believe I 
have the know-how and the 
get-up-and-go to serve the 
people in this capacity. I have 
had 35 years of experience in 
plumbing contracting--which 
includes gas, water and sewer 
maintenance and repairs. I also 
worked for a number of years 
with El Paso Natural as 
Company, working on pipeline 
installation and maintenance. 
Five years I was with the Army 
Corps of Engineers, at Biggs 
Field, Texas in utilities 
maintenance. 
I feel that the need, now, is to 

utilize our resources, and to 
start to work on our gas system 
then our streets. I feel that now 
is the time to encourage new 
business and industries. If 
Rising Star intends to grow, it 

WHERE THREE GOOD 

TEXAS COUNTIES 

GET TOGETHER 

Progress Is -

Making Good Things 

Happen 

In the weekend Blue Bonnet 
Relays held in Brownwood, 
Phil Mitchell set about 
breaking his own records set 
last year in the pole vault. This 
years mark bettered the old by 
a foot and a half. 

Rising Star teamsters also 
competed in the track met and 
a complete results tally follows. 

CLASS A- B 
LONG JUMP- 1. Phil Mit-

chell, May 20- 9; 2. Mark Th-
weatt.Mozelle 20- 3' 2 ; 3. Victor 
Storey, Early 19- 10'2; 4. C. 
Brown, Hamlin 19- 10; Jones, 
Hamlin 19- 4; 6. Bret Martin, 
Brownwood 9th, 19- 2. 

SHOT 	PUT- 1. 	Jerry 
Tumlinson, Rule 49- 8'4; 2. 
Robert Baiza, Rule 49- 81 4; 3. 
Mark Thweatt, Mozelle 48- 914: 
4. Toby Hare, DeLeon 48- 6'2; 
5. Bill Wedeman, Brownwood 
JV 46- 9; 6. Ken Barthold, 
Brownwood JV 46- 8'2. 

POLE VAULT- 1. Phil 
Mitchell, May 14- 0; (New 
record, old record of 12- 6 set 
by Mitchell in 1976. 2. Steve 
Rowe, Rochelle 13- 0; 3. David 
Miller, Goldthwaite, 13- 0; 4. 
Mark Thweatt, Mozelle 12- 6; 5. 
David Bullard, Early 12- 6; 6. 
Nicky Newbury, Rising Star 
12- 0. 

MILE RUN,- 1. Donald 
Bullard, Early 4:55'); 2. Andy 
Lopez, DeLeon 5:01; 3. Hectyor 
Puebla, Rule 5:03.3; 4. David 
Mullins, Bangs 5:07.1; 5. Mike 
Yancy, Bangs, 5:06.6; 6. 
Wilson, Rising Star 5:17.0. 

440 	YARD RELAY- 1. 
Hamlin 45:8; 2. Cross Plains 
46.3; 3. May 46.5; 4. Bangs 46.6: 
5. Goldthwaite 46.8; Deleon 
46.0. 

880 YARD RUN- I. Wes 
Kittley, Rule 2:02.5 (New 
Record old record 2:05.2 set by 
Brent Newton, Bangs 1974) 2. 
Ted Murphree, May 2:02.6, 3. 

Mike Bullard, Early 2:07.0; 4. 
Dwain Gibson. Bangs 2:07.0. 4. 
Mark Hoffman, Brownwood 
9th, 2:09.0; 6. Mike Hertel, Rule 
2:10.0. 

120- YARD HIGH HUR-
DLES- 1. C. Brown, Hamlin 
14.9 (Ties meet record set by 
Tommy Cleere, De Leon 1976) 
2. Maberry, Hamlin 15:1; 3. 
Johnny Allison, Bangs 15.5; 4. 

Washington 
The Eastland County Farm 

Bureau will send two 
representatives to the Texas 
Farm Bureau's National Af- 
fairs 	Comfer;.•nce 	in 
Washington, 	D.C. 	and 
Williamsburg, Va., March 21 to 
25, according to C.M. Guthery 

' of Desdemona, president. 
Those who will attend from 

Eastland County are: Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Shults of Route 1 
Rising Star. 

The local county organization 
qualifiee to send thse 
representatives by complying 
with requirements of the state 
organization concerning its 
1977 program of work and 
membership acquisition 
program. 

Purpose of the conference is 
to give county FB leaders in-
sight into the workings of the 
national government. 
familiarize them with curcial 
national issues, and strengthen 
relationships with members of 
the Texas delegation in 
Congress. 

One of the highlights of the 
trip will be a visit to the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture 
complex and possibly a 
meeting with Agriculture 
Secretary Bob Bergland. The 
group also will make many 
sightseeing trips in Virginia 
and Washington. 



YOUR KEY to Buy, Sell or Trade Anything 
ARE THE CLASSIFIEDS 

Thursday, March 24, 1977 rY- 

SMALL ACREAGE 
73 acres Northwest of Ranger with good sandy land. 
53 acres on the pavement with city water. Near Morton Valley. 
28 acres located near Lake Leon. Only $14,000.00. 
6 acres near Carbon with a 3 bedroom, 1 bath home. 
5 acres with a 3 bedroom home, store build ing and living 

quarters in Morton Valley. 
3 acres with a 2 bedroom, 1 bath home in Olden. 

FARMS AND RANCHES 
80 acres with a 2 bedroom, 1 bath home near Scranton. $31,500.00. 
279 acres located between Eastland and Cisco. $300 per acre. 15 

percent down and owner will finance. 
148 acres near Lake Leon with some cultivation, on pavement, 

some lake frontage and one- half minerals. $600.00 per acre. 	• 
415 acres Southeast of Ranger with deer and turkey. On Colon 'y 

Creek. $300 per acre. 
779 acres 6 miles Southwest of Carbon with coastal, love grass, 

blue stem, side oats, and some minerals. Sabanna River runs 
through part of place. $265 per acre and owner will finance. A good 

plae.l4c00 acres in Eastland County with highway frontage. Terms can 
be arranged and owner will finance. A nice place. 

1250 acres in Coleman County with a real nice home, river, and 
pecan trees. Terms can be arranged. 

200 acres South of Carbon, on pavement with a 3 bedroom rock 
home, 62 acres in cultivation, 26 acres of peanuts, and good fences. 
Terms. 

491 acres in Eastland County with nice brickhome, some coastal, 
fenced and cross fences. kApproximately one- half minerals. 
Shown by appointment only. 

160 acres with a 3 bedroom home, fireplace, 2 good tanks, natural 
gas, on pavement with city water. Some love grass. 

150 acres South of Eastland, 140 acres in coastal with good fences, 
on county road with city water. $425 per acre. 

74 acres with cultivation on county road North of Eastland with 
city water. $400 per acre. 

1450 acres near Albany with approximately $900 a month oil in-
come, and on pavement. $265 per acre. 

150 acres North of Eastland on pavement with 77 acres of 
cultivatio and city water. $400 per acre. 

150 acres South of Cisco with good fences and some minerals. $315 
per acre. 

152 acres near Eastland with city water, ele ctricity and 
telephone available. Located on Interstate 20. Will sell all or will 
subdivide. 

163 acres wi th 25 acres in coastal, 17 acres in love grass, and lots 
of pecan trees. On Sabanna River, 31/2  miles Southwest of Gorman. 

344 acres with 1 mile of Leon River with a 2 bedroom, 1 bath 2600 
square foot home with a smaller type house with 3 rooms and 1 
bath. 

160 acres Southeast of Ranger with deer and half minerals. $325 
per acre. 

160 acres South of Cisco with highway frontage 'and good fences. 
668 acres, some improved grasses, with a 2 bedroom home, good 

barns, and good well water. Located in S tephens County. 
612 acres near Lake Leon with a large 2 bedroom home, on 

pavement, with 174 acres of cultivation, good fences, good peans 
and barn. 

75:3 acres in Stepheens County. Good deer country. $315 per acre. 
4020 acres in Stephens County with good fences and plenty of 

water. Lots of improved grasses. No minerals. $210 per acre. 
1500 acres in Palo Pinto County. ,lots of water and good deer 

hunting: $300 per acre. 
100 acres South of Eastland with 50 acres of coastal and 25 acres 

in love grass. $400 per acre. 
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 

Established business that does a good volume. Terms can be 
arranged. Located in Cisco. 

2 commercial type buildings located near downtown Eastland. 
Priced right, only $13,000.00. 

Beauty shop and two lots in Eastland. Can be bought as is or shop 
can be moved. 

8 acres located on Interstate 20 near Ranger. 
In Eastland: 

3 bedroom, 2 bath home on corner lot. $32,500.00.  
3 bedroom, 2 bath brickl home only 5 months old. Pay equity and 

assume total payment of $29,800.00. 
5 bedrooms, 11/2  bath home with 3 lots. 
New large 2 bedroom, 11/2  bath duplex with carpet and built- ins. 

Priced below appraisal value. 
Large 1 bedroom, 1 bath home with carpet and paneling. In good 

location. 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home with carport and storage room. 

$12,000.00. 
New duplex on Conner Street. 2 bedroom, 1 bath with capret and 

built- ins and storage room. Can assume loan. 
2 bedroom, 1 bath on large lot with 12 pecan trees. Real nice. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath home with double garage, carpet, enclosed 

heated swimming pool. Nice location. $60,000.00. 
1 bedroom duplex on South Connellee with carpet. 
Large 2 bedroom, 1 bath home on corner lot with carpet. Only 

$12,800.00. 
3 bedroom, 1 bath home on North Connellee that has been com- 

pletely remodeled. $15,000.00. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath large older type home with 3 lots. 

Other Locations: 
1 bedroom, 1 bath furnished lake cabin on deeded lot. $9,000.00. 
2 bedroom 1 bath Mobil home on nice lot in Ranger. 
3 bedroom, 1 bath home with approximately 1 acre. Located in 

Olden. Only $10,800.00. 
6 lots in the city of Ranger in good location. Only $8500.00. 

We Have Other Listings 
Large and Small 

All LISTINGS WILL 
BE APPRECIATED. 

Office Phone  629- 1725 	  
Hiway 80 East 	

 Pat Maynard 
Home 629. 8063 

Eastland, Texas 
 

PLUMBING PROBLEMS 
Call Hutchens Plumbing 
Co. for dependable and 
reliable sen Ice, reasonable 
rates. Water heaters also 
sold and installed. Licensed 
and Bonded. 

442.3803 
LEWIS HUTCHENS 

Rt. 2, Box 70 
Cisco, Texas 

12-271 

I 

V../1 011•0 A•V,Ivro of 

[Need Avon 
Products? 

Contact your Represen-
tative Evelyn Donharn, 
Phone: 643- 4141 or see at 
The Rising Star office. 8- 
tfc 	 • 

	11 

WANTED TO BUY 
Second hand hog ice ler. 

Bill Sessums 
725- 7624 	12- ltc 

WANTED- Someone to sell 
fabric remnants and scraps. 
Can be in your home. We will 
license you and place fabric to 
be sold on consignment. Con-
tact Davis Fabrics, 610 West 
2nd, Cisco. Phone 817- 442-
3989. 

Hauling 
Sand, caliche and gravel 

R.D. Creech 
Phone: 643- 3613 

2 tfc 

LISTING NEEDED! 
Have prospective buyers for 
homes, farms and ranches. 

Jenkins Insurance Agency 
Rising Star, Tex. 

Phone 817 
Phone 817-643.2251. 

48-tfc 

WANTED  
General General office: secretarial and' 
light bookkeeping duties, office 
located at ranch 15 miles west 
of DeLeon. Salary and hours to 
be discussed. Send letter will 
resume and photog, aph to 
Gibson Land and Cattle Co., 
1111 Ridglea Bank Bldg.,. Ft. 
Worth, Tx. 76116 11- 4tc 

NOTICE 
Carpet cleaning- heavy 
sha mpoo followed by cold 
water rinse, extractor removes 
all dirt into barrel. 

Is your carpet flooded? Have 
machine to remove or extract 

• water from carps Re' . ,••es 
in Rising Star. Finic. 11 
Boyd, (915) 356- 2454. 52tin 

I will lease your land for oil 
or gas! Wanted to buy: shut 
in gas wells or gas 
production. 

John T. Yount 
Box 1703 

San Angelo, Tex. 76902 
915- 949- 1077 

Income Tax Preparation 
Have completed i3 week 
study course. 

Carolyn Ratliff 
643- 6783 

WANTED 
Need part or full time clean- 

up man, Would consider high 
school boy. 

Johnston Truck & Supply 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443 

12- 2tc 

DIESEL MECHANICS 
We need 2 experienced, 

dependable, 	sober diesel 
mechanic s 	now. We pay 
all of company major medical, 
workmans comp. paid 
vacation, etc. Will guarantee 
$12,000 plus. 

joimstoli Truck & Supply 
Cross Plains. Texas 76443 

12- 2tc 

WANTED 
Carpenter work of any kind, 

$5.00 hour. Henry Allen. Phone 
after 6 p.m. 259- 2298. 12- 4tp 

Dr. Merle M Ellis 
Optometrist 

308 Citizens Nat'l Bank 

Building 
Brownwood, Texas 

GLASSES 
CONTACT LENSES 

Call 646 - B778 

or Write P.O. Box 149 
ara- 

Do\ "f LET ANYONE 
TELL YOU THAT YOU 
CAN'T 
\F- FORD YOUR OWN 
Ill SI K 

Let us shpw you how our 
financing plan can help you 
turn ht• dream of a spacious 
new all brick home into a 
living reality' 

( all K. B. Homes collect 
it7 - 112- 3024 

Nights, 142- 2070 

We have qualified buyers 
for land in this area. If you 
are interested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

Jimmy Partin 

Insurance 

And Realty Co. 
3434 North 6th St. 

office Phone 673 - 2371 

Alvin Hackfeld 692 - 9597 
Venita Raymond 692 - 5244 

BULLS 
Registered Polled Ilereford 
hulls for sale. Ilenry Fry & 
Son, 442- 1767. 

HOME REPAIR SERVICE 
Carpentry -curbing 
fencing-painting 

no charge for estimates 
442-3136 or 442-1370 

Fast, Dependable 
Film Developing 
Palace Drug Store 
Rising Star, Texas 

eslisN.N.As 1 i %%% 't % ''.. se% \ • %.1"/' 

O 0 

ALFORD DRILLING CO. 
to Water wells, shallow oil e 
o's  wells, See Tommy or t • 
• Curtis. Phone 817-643-2394 • 
a 52-tfc 	

t 
• i 

-isa..vs.vis•vis--so.nytiva.vit 
I t 

Heavy Oat Hay 
For Sale 

New Crop 
Call 653-2223 

Olden t38 

Red Gap Western Store 
I.H. 20 Cisco 
Wrangler Levis 
Tony Lama Sanders 
Don Gay Rodeo Equip. 
Panhandle Slim 
Open 9-6 Thurs. tW 8)30 
Justin Roper $3730 

CARD 
OF THANKS 

`?" 

FOR SALE 
BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

DIRECTORY 
HOUSE FOR SALE 

Newly remodeled inside and 
out. Three bedroom, living 
room, kitchen, dining room, 
and bath. All areas carpeted. 
Located on large lot with 
several pecan trees. 

Jenkins Insurance Agency 
817- 643- 2251. 12tfc 

The following persons have 
authorized this newspaper to 
announce their candidacy for 
political office: 

FOR SALE 
Hay- grazer hay for sale. 
Phones 643- 6403 or 643- 4261. 
2- tfc 

BALLINGER TRUCK & 
TRACTOR CO. 

Box 640 
Ballinger, Texas 76821 
Phone: 915- 365- 2324 

Hwy. 67 West 
New Tractors in stock 

F- 1086- D's 
F- 1586- D's 

I- 4166- D 
New and used equipment 

Parts and Service 
9- ltc 

For Sale- 73 Dodge Charger 
less than 25,000 miles. Ph. 643-
3713,Johnny Clay 47- tfr. 

POLITICAL 
COLUMN 

MAYOR- 
W.G. (Bill) Reed 

John W. Lee FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
The old hospital 7114 E. 23rd, 
Cisco. Call 442- 3574. 130 

COUNCILMAN 
W.L. (Bill) Medley 

unAiN LINK FENCE 
Good quality 

Reasonable Rates 
Work guaranteed 

*LB. EEO, 112 - 1370 after 

/ 

H.L. Killion 
Charlie Chamberlain 

Louis Mayfield 
Lane Wells 
Rolland Atwood 
Weldon Lee 
Charlie Benson REAL ESTATE 

70.5 A, 131/2  A peanuts. 32 A 
coastal, good well, 1/2  minerals. 
well fenced, pavement. 8 miles 
East of Rising Star. 

Approximately IA: 3 vr. old•2 
bedroom home. Neat kitchen, 
paneling, good well, sub. 
pump. on pavement. 2 miles of 
Rising Star. $10.000. 

Listing Appreciated 
Dehon Coghurn Realty 

Phone 893-6666 
Nites 893-5898 

DeLeon 

FOR SALE- New lovely 
Spanish- style home. 3 
bedroom, 11/2  baths, very 
good location, nice sized 
fenced yard, large storage 
bldg. 425.500. 413 So. 
Walnut. Consider any trade, 
offered by Joseph Homes-
629- 21(05. 126 

School board 
Linda Butler 

Nilliniggit~MUORINAM 

MISSING 
Female toy fox- terrier white 

with black and brown around 
head and face, with a large 
black spot on tummy. Rabies 
tag No. 1332. If anyone knows 
the whereabouts of this little 
dog, please call collect 214-
874- 4520. after 3:30 p.m. 
Wednesday and anytime 
Friday or therafter. REWARD. 
12- ltc 

Cr  
Tax Returns Prepared 

Prompt. Accurate, confidential 
Service; Experienced tax 
accountant. Mrs. W.R. (Pat) 
Ervin Call: 725-6156. 1-tfc 

$300 REWARD 
For information pertaining to 
Mr. and Mrs. Ines Sierra or 
Sirra, they were married in 
Rising Star in 1917 and both 
passed away a few years later. 
You may contract me at this 
address. Mrs. Petra Giatan, 
2706 Larimer St., Denver, 
Colorado. 80205. 11- tfc 

Coastal Bermuda Sprigs and 
Sprigging. Call: R.L. (Bob) 
Rust 643-3137. life 

Pros! 41-t fc 

IRRIGATION EQUIPMENT 
A complete line of irrigation 

equipment.• Submersible, 
Centrifugal and Turbine 
Pumps, Pipe Fittings, Volume 
Guns and Circle Systems. Let 
us help you with your irrigation 
needs. Machine Shop and parts 
for' pump repair- - Test Pit 
Facilities. Also come take a 
look at our patented Fertilizer-
Herbicide- Chemical Ap-
plicator for chemical and 
fertilizer distribution through 
irrigation lines. Largest supply 
in Central Texas. 

KIMMELL IRRIGATION 
SUPPLY, INC. 

I I ighway 6 DeLeon, Texas 76444 
Phone: 817- 893- 6266 

6- 27tc 

FOR SALE OR TRADE- - New 
2,800 sq. ft. brick home in Cross 
Plains with 28 acres. Central 
heat and fireplace. Pecan and 
fruit trees. Will consider trade 
on improved or unimproved 
land. 817- 725- 6635. 5 

Sell Shaklee Products 
Natural food sup-
plements, concertraled 
bio- degradable 
household cleaners, 
natural 	skin 	care 
products, toiletries, baby 
care products. 

Earn 35 per cent to 40 
per cent on retail sales 
plus bonuses of from 3 per 
cent to 23 per cent 
depending on purchase 
volume. Bonus trips and 
cars also available. 

For more information 
call 817- 647- 1045. 

• 
1 
1 
a 

Long ?naner Polled Hereford 
Farm-Two cows bred to Victor 
N-I6 Bull. One cow and bull 
calf or Victor N-69 Bull. Bulls 
for'sale from 6 mo. to 3 iirs. old. 
Open and bred heifers for sale. 
call 817-249-1776. T6 

"NO JOB TOO SMALL" 
*Insurance claim work Wel-
come. 
*Auto paint specialists. 
*Wrecks rebuilt-dent work. 
*Free estimate. 
Lester Reed Paint and Body 

Shop 
3 1/2 mi. on Hwy 36 E. 

Phone 817-643-4174 

White and Elna authorized 
sewing machine dealer. 
Repair all kinds, by factory 
trained mechanic. DAVIS 
FABRICS, 61(1 W. 2nd, 
Cisco. p- tfc 

FOR SALE- Br. angus bull 
past 4 years old. Call 629- 1584 
after 5 weekdays or anytime 
weekends. If 

V • • Notice: We buy sell or trade 
cameras. Call if you have a 35 
mm or any other type camera 
for sale. Call Stephen Priv!' g 
or Photography-629.2682. T13 , 	 

FOR SALE 
1976 Longhorn Travel Trailer 

(used twice) Contact Mack 
Gray. 643- 6563 call around 
noon or after 6 p.m. 12- ltc 

NOIR 	poy instant cash 
for toir old atilos-whole. Call 
Brow ow ood Irian' 	Metal, 
culled for price quote. phone 
915 - 646- 70514. l 6-tic 

Did you know- That if we 
don't have it we'll order it 
for you, if we can. Shaklee 
and Health Foods on the 
Square in Eastland 629-
8171. Tf 

The Rising Star Jaycee 
Organization meets on 
Thursday night at 7:30 in 
the Scout Hut. 

David Harris, Pres. 
David Pollock V. Pres. 

Ray Daniels Sec.-Treas. 

MORGAN'S CABINET SHOP 
Star Route 

Carbon, Texas 
Phone 643- 6517 

CUSTOM BUILT CABINETS 

BUSINESS FOR SALE 
Lowell Thomas Sales 
Building or Land or 
everything. 608 W. Main, 
Eastland, Tx. t18 

FARM FENCING 
Built to ASCS specs. 

reasonable rates-good work 
442-3136 or 442-1370. 

BARTON PLUMBING off- 
ers dependable service at 
reasonable rates. 

New installation or repair 
work. 

Tom Barton 
Ph. 643-1283 
Rising Star 

47-tfc 

I buy 	junk cars 	and 	will 
remove old 	car 	bodies. 
629-1235. 	189 

Need a babysitter? Call 259-
2244 (May) will sit at my home 
5 'to 6 days a week. 12- 2ttp 

FOR SALE- House in Cisco 
3 bedroom. 0-2  bath, brick 
large laundry room and 
garage. I yr. old. Call 442- 
3407. (28 

WADLEY CONSTRUCTION 
Building- Remodeling 
Maintenance- Repair 

Interior- Exterior 
Finishing 

No Job to small 
817- 842- 5933 Sidney 

We do costal sprigging also 
dig and sell costal spriggs. 

E.D. (Lige) Williams 
Shop ph. 893- 6730 
Home ph. 893- 6870 

127 

Like new 1971 Mobile Home in 
Brownwood, Tx. 14' wide x 48', 
2 bedroom, central heat and 
air, many extras $5500.00 647-
1809 or 915- 356- 3334. 110 

FOR SALE 
Approximately 1300 feet of 2" 

construction pipe. Phone 643- 
2702. 11- 2tc 

HIGH SCHOOL 
DROPOUTS 

If you now possess the desire 
to finish High School and obtain 
a skill through Technical School 
we will pay ALL living expenses 
plus Tuition and books and 
provide a salary. Write 
Brownwood Bulletin, c-o Box 
NR, Brownwood. Texas 76801. 
10-tfc 

FOR SALE- 4 yr. old 
registered Angus bull. Good 
performance. Phone: 643- 6782. 
10tfc 

FOR 	SALE- Case 	830 
Wheatland tractor in good 
running condition. Phone: 259-
2841. 10tfc 

URGENT 
I need a 2 or 3 bedroom house, 

furnished or unfurnished to 
rent immediately. - Would 
perfer one in the county, hot 
will take one in town. Contact 
Bill Hubbard at Skelly Truck 
Stop- 643- 2642 anytime day or 
night. 12- 21p 

NOW OPEN 
The Quilt Box 

Remnants and quilt scraps, 
dacron batting the quilts, 
Shredded foam and sheet foam 
for cushions. Mary Ann Un- 
derwood, 643- 2502, One block 
south of Rising Star Clinic. 11- 
4tp 

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Johnny Flippin 

would like to thank each and 
everyone who donated blood to 
be used during his recent open 
heart surgery at Childrens 
Medical Center in Dallas. A 
special thanks to the Rising 
Star Emergency Club. May 
God bless each of you. 12- ltc 

FOR SALE 
Farmall C Tractor 650 and 

milk cow, Phone: 643- 3662. 
12- 2tc 

Peanut Trailer available• 
Bramlett Implements 
Stephenville, Texas 817- 965-
3480 mini66 T102 

WANTED 
Our parts department and 

sales are growing and we need 
someone part time to assist 
parts manager. 

Johnston Truck & Supply 
Cross Plains. Texas 76443 

FOR SALE 
1962 Rambler in running 

condition. Call 643- 3707. 12- 
1tp 

Finest Ladies Ready to Wear in 
West Texas would like you to 
take advantage of their Pre-
Easter Sale. Drastic reductions 
on spring and summer dresses 
and sportswear. Famous 
Brands 

C&G Fashions 
125 W. Walker 

Breckenridge, Tex. 
t20 

NOTICE 
Persons needing tran-

sportation to City Hall for the 
April 2nd election May call 
643- 6844. And transportation 
will be provided by Mrs. Delta 
Madison. 12- 2tc 

Rising Star Homecoming 
has been set for October 8, 
1977. 

Desks, 	chairs,files, 
safes,tabies, 	cash 	and 
carry. Save 20- 50 Per cent. 

Large 	selection. 	9- 5:30 
weekdays. 	Value City, 1030 
Butternut, Abilene. 	t- tf 

Men's and Boy's 
Insulated Coveralls 

8  
Open Weekdays 8:30 to 
6:00 BSAL3u1nEr TNa$y191.e9: 

Trading
0a0m at to 

Post
5 : 00 . 

t94 

NOTICE: We buy sell or 
trade cameras. Call if you 
have a 35 mm or any other 
type camera for sale. Call 
Stephen 	Printing 	or 
Photography, 	629- 2682. 
Eastland. 	t13 

CARD 
OF THANKS M. L. Terrell 	 Rodger Terrell 

Home 629- 2443 	  Hassan- 2896 H.V. O'BRIEN. Publisher,  
;MRS. MIKE DONHAM, Editor 

Second Class Postage paid at Rising Styr, 
Texas, under Act of Congress oh March, 
1870. 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: In Rising Star 
and adjoining counties, $4.00 per year; in 
Texas, $5.00 per year; elsewhere in the U.S. 
and foreign countries, $8.00 per year. 
NOTICE: Any erroneous reflection upon,i 
the character, standing, or reputation a 
any person, firm or corporation which may 
appear in the columns of this newspapet 
will be gladly corrected upon being brought 
to the attention of the editor. All ad-
vertising orders are accepted. 

LOST IN SPATE 
TAX LAW ? 
T e Compirolle is °Ms wantsiosul 

ewe, some of the red talw 4,0  Ini .̂".  
s tay for 10141 taxpayers. Thies why we 
haw a tolldeet tax information hotline for 
your konvenience If you have Y flaw II 
problem or question. call us withoui chain-
Iron, any where in 7016i 

1-800-252-5555 

BARBARA JO KANADY 
SHAKLEE DISTRIBUTOR 
We carry natural food 
supplements, concentrated 
1310-degradable household 
cleaners, natural skin care 
products, toiletries and 
baby products. Phone: 643-
3291 after 6 p.m. 504tp 

CARD OF THANKS 
I want to thank each and 

every one who sent me cards 
and letters while I was in the 
hospital. Especially for the 
prayers, I ask God's blessing 
for each of you. 

Vina Whit e 
Cash for your used piano 
Send description and asking 
price to: 

Ken Mayhall Music Co. 
3532 B, 6th St. 

Abilene, Tx. 79603 

z 	 Viv want in heir. and one rho's. sell 
vs V 11111‘. looney. alter  

ryi oft,' 

as. 

oh Hulio..1. 

iillirirallef 	Puhlo. 

NOW OPEN 
..Cole's Army Surplus 207 
W. Commerce Eastland, 
Texas come by and try us. The Comptroller of 

Public Accounts 
WANTED: Blackberries Call 
629- 1707. tf 

WANTED 
Position available for relief 

laundry lady 2 days a week. 
Apply in person to Twilite Acre 
Nursing Home, Rising Star, 
Texas. 12- tfc 



Thursday, March 24, 1977 

prayers to our Heavenly Father 
and wish them the best of life 
inspite of our momentary 
problems. 

May each and all find the 
happiness and the peace we 
want as we endeavor to witness 
and serve our Lord and Master. 
Come by and visit with us and if 
we can be of help one to another 
let us know. May Our good Lord 
find each of in Worship each 
Sunday. 

Hubert Taylor 

Two men stood in front of the 
prison window one night. One 
saw the stars, the other saw 
only the bars. Which one are 
you? 

Host Ministers, 
G.D. Justice 
Don Bruce 
104 Main St. 

Sunday Morning services at 
10:00 a.m. Sunday Eve at 7:00 
p.m. Midweek Services Thurs. 
at 7:30 p.m. 

FROM OUR CHURCHES First United 

Methodist Church 

Christian 
Fellowship 

Church 

Church 
Of 

Christ 

OIL NEWS 
First Baptist 

Church 

experience. :Try a regular 
devotional period every day for 
a month, and see what happens 
to your faith. Try living for a 
month as if you expected God 
and the world of nature and 
people to cooperate with you. 
See what hapens. Attend 
regularly services of Divine 
Worship, 	eagerly 	and 
thoughtfully for a while and see 
whether God become more real 
to you. 
Out of this crucible of your won 

experience there will come a 
renewal of your faith in God. 
You will be living in harmony 

with him and therefore have the 
religious insight with which to 
be aware of his presence. God 
is the heart of our faith; he is its 
beginning and its end. He is the 
answer to our deepest 
questions. Seek him in a 
sincere determination and a 
new life will be opened up unto 
you. 

• 

Today it is very difficult for 
many people to have faith in 
God. This is because we have 
gone (he -ugh a global war and 
the world has been brought to 
the brink of doubt and despair. 
All ages are not like our own, 
however, for faith in God rises 
and falls with the centuries. 
Ages of faith and doubt succeed 
one another. Today we are in a 
valley of religious indifference 
and doubt. This.  means that we 
must guard and nourish our 
religion very carefully of 
religious depression. most of us 
want a deep and thrilling faith 
in God. How can we have it? 
The experience of other people 

often helps us to develop a faith 
of our own. Particularly when 
this experience is expressed by 
men of authority and people 
whom we trust. they are very 
helpful to us. it puts us at the 
receiving end of those words of 
Our Lord, when he said: "Let 
your light so shine before men 
that they may see your good 
works and glorify your Father 
who is in heaven." 

Several of our membership are 
reported to be ill from some 
virus and colds, however, none 
are reported to be seriously 
affected. Mr. E.L. Amis has 
been discharged from the 
Hendricks Hospital in Abilene 
and is home recovering and 
doing very well. Mr. Ted 
Hudson was admitted to the 
Graham Memorial Hospital in 
Cisco last Saturday. It is not 
known at this time what his 
problems were. however, he is 
not serious and should be back 
home in a couple of days. For 
each of these. as for all our 
friends and members we lift our 

Comanche Crude Oil Corp. of 
Fort Worth will drill No. 1 W.H. 
Smith Corp. as a proposed 
3,750- foot wildcat in Eastland 
County. 

Location is 10 miles northeast 
of Rising Star on 82- acre lease. 

It spots 330 feet from the 
south and 2,130 feet from the 
east lines of Section 15, Block 3, 
H&TC Survey. 

- - - 
A location was staked 11 

miles south of Cisco in the 
Foster (Marble Falls) Field in 
the Sunrise Petroleum Co., 
Cisco, No. 1 Graham. 

The planned 3,100- foot 
venture spots on a 40- acre 
lease. 

Site is 853 feet from the north 
and 1.787 feet from the west 
'lines of Section 55, Block 3, 
H&TC Survey. 

Universal 
Full Gospel 

Assembly 

God is a good God! Are you a 
happy Christian today?? We 
should be a happy and joyus 
people. When one accepts 
Jesus Christ as his or her 
personel Savior and is born into 
the Family of God. That one is 
set free front the bondage of Sin 
and Becomes a new creature in 
Christ Jesus. Leaving behind 
the old way of life with its 
malice, hatred. selfishness. 
unkindness. bitterness. 
uncleanness, covetousness and 
fornication, and walking in a 
newness of life. A life filled with 
the fruits of the Spirit: "Love. 
Joy. Peace. Longsuffering. 
gentleness. goodness, faith, 
meekness and temperance." 
Galations 5-22.23. 
If we arc not walking in the 

newness of life in Christ Jesus 
and bearing the fruits of the 
Spirit we arc not a member of 
the Family of God. St. John 
15-5; "I am the Vine. yc are the 
branches. He that .abideth in 
me. and 1 in Him, the' sante 
bringeth forth much fruit: for 
without me. ye can do 
nothing". 

St. John 15-2; Every branch 
in m6 that beareth not fruit he 
taketh away: and every branch 
that beareth fruit. He purgeth it 
that it may bring forth more 
fruit." 
when we look at the fruit on a 

peach tree, we expect to see 
peaches. An apple tree bears 
apples, not lemons. So a 
Christian bears good fruit, the 
fruits of the Spirits. not the 
fruits of the flesh which are; , 
Idolatry, witchcraft, hatred, 
variance, emulations, wrath. 
strife, seditious. heresies. 
en vyings. 	Murders. 
drunkenness. revellings and 
such like." Galations 5-20-21. 
"They which do such things 
shall not enherit the Kingdon of 
God." May we search our 
hearts and find an hones answer 
to this question. What kind of 
frit am I bearing, the fruits of 
the Spirit or the fruits of the 
Flesh. 

We invite you to come and visit 
with us. If you do not have a 
church home we extend a warm 
welcome to you to worship with 
Us. 

May God Bless each one. 
Vernon McGinn Pastor 

Another basis for a vigorous 
religious faith is our own 
persoanl experience., Faith is 
not a theory; it is action.. A 
person needs to act upon what 
faith he now has and thus make 
religion 'a matter of vital 

Learning to live with other 
people is both trying and fif-
ficult at times. 

The christian is not at a loss 
as to what and how to relate to 
other people. The Bible has 
much to say on the subject of 
human relations. 

Think on the following from 
the book, of Proverbs. 

"Every man is right in his 
own eyes." 

"For lack of wood the fire 
goes out, and where there is no 
whisperer, contention ceases." 

"A fool gives full vent to his 
anger, but the wise man, 
holding it back. quiets it." 

"A brother offended is harder 
to be won than a strong city." 

From Ecclesiastes we 
learn," Two are better than 
one, because they gain great 
reward in their toil. For if they 
fall, the one will lift up his 
companion; but woe to the one 
alone who falls, when there is 
no other to lift him up." 

Calvin A. Primus has written 
what he calls a "Short course in 
Human relations." 

The six most important 
words: 
I admit I made a mistake. 

The five most important 
words: 
You did a good job. 

The four most important 
words: 
What is your opinion. 

The three most important 
words: 
If you plea," 

The two most important 
words: 
Thank you. 

The one most important 
word: 
We. 

The least important word: 
I. 

R.D. Williams, Pastor 

SEE OUR SELECTION OF 

CARPETS  il J\  

"In Everything Give Thanks 
When Paul and Silas were 

falsely accused, beaten and 
thrown into prison, they could 
have had a good reason to 
complain for their misfortune. 
But the beauty of this story is 
that they didn't. No doubt the 
severe beating they had 
received was painful and 
almost unbearable but,  instead 
of finding fault with their ac-
cusers and with Gnd, they 
began to pray and praise God 

the condition they found 
themselves in. "And at mid-
night Paul and Silas prayed, 
and sang praises unto God: and 
the prisoners heard them" Acts 
16:25. 

Usually the midnight hour 
speaks of the pending doom of 
nn angry God, to most 
Christians. That midnight hour 
suggests the hour of judgment. 
But has it ever dawned upon 
our minds that midnight is the 
beginning of a new day? Does it 
not suggest that the old is 
passed and the time for the new 
is about to begin? True, the 
hour may appear dark but 
nevertheless, as the hours 
begin to pass it becomes lighter 
and lighter with the full arrival 
of the sun. 

"Rejoice evermore," wrote 
Paul. "Pray without ceasing. 
In everything give thanks: for 
this is the will of God in Christ 
Jesus concerning you." 1st 
Thes. 16:18. If we could learn 
this secret which Paul and Silas 
Practiced we would find life 
much easier to understand and 
cope with. It is very hard to 
praise and give God thanks, 
when things are going wrong. 
But it can be done! 

Something happened when 
Paul and Silas praised God. 
The foundations of the prison 
were shaken and every door 
was opened and every 
prisoner's band were loosed. 
Practice giving thanks unto the 
Lord daily. See if it doesn't 
make a big difference in your.  

life. Our attitude makes the 
difference. Our visions differ. 

Here then is the Biblical 
definition of the "New Birth". 
It is of the "water" and the 
"Spirit". It involves both the 
work of God and the reaction of 
man. God has provided the 
means (the blood of Jesus), has 
told us how to appropriate 
forgiveness (faith, repentance 
and baptism), which he offers 
ihrough grace (Ephesians 
2:8-9), and has urged that we 
accept this loving gift of his and 
live as "new creatures" (2 
Corinthians 5:17). 
Bible study should be a family 

affair. We have a Bible class for 
every age group: on Sunday at 
9:30 a.m., on Wednesday at 7 
p.m., and we urge also your 
attendance at the Assemblies: 
on Sudnay at 10:30 a.m. and 6 
p.m. 
We extend our sympathy to 

Vonda White. following the 
death week before last of her 
mother Mrs. May Dillard. in 
Cross Plains. We also sorrow 
with Dchila Walker and the 
family, following the death of 
her first great-grandchild: the 
child of Mr. and Mrs. Randy 
Wynne. of Woodward, 
Oklahoma. Death came shortly 
after birth Monday before last. 
Our sick seem to be improved. 

Ruth Middleton is home and 
able to be out some now. Vina 
White is also back home and 
was with us Sunday. Effie 
Williams says she is feeling 
better. Pearl Lockhart has been 
having a hard time lately, with 
all the dust. Buck Maples has 
not been feeling good the last 
several weeks. Several have the 
flu. Sue Barnes is doing some 
better. 
We enjoyed having the two 

preachers with us from France 
Sunday before last, as well as 
the chorus from Crowley's 
Ridge Christian College. 
God bless you during this week 

and beyond. Call us if we can 
serve you in any way. 

- 	Owen Aikin 

The New Testament speaks of 
the "New Birth" (John 3:3-21). 
It is said to be of "water and of 
the Spirit" (John 3:5) Is this 
purely an operation of God, 
through the overwhelming, 
formative action of His Spirit, or 
is it a cooperative process, 
involving both the work of God 
and man? 
In Matthew 28:19, as well as in 

Mark 16:15 and Luke 24:46-49, 
Jesus sends his apostles out to 
"preach the Gospel to every 
creature." The end result of 
thiS was to be "salvation" 
(Mark 16:16) or "remission of 
sins" (Luke 24:47). Obviously, 
this was the definition of that 
which Jesus had called the 
"New Birth", in John 3; that 
which would permit one to 
,'enter into the kingdom of 
God" (John 3:5). But, the 

• question comes again: How 
does this come about? 
When the Spirit came on 

Pentecost (Acts2) and the 
Gospel was announced for the 
first time, by Peter. sinners 
were convicted through the 
message (Acts 2:37). Jesus had 
said that the Holy Spirit would 
do precisely that (John 16:7-I1). 
How was it done? Through the 
preached Work! Jesus called 
the word the "Seed of the 
kingdom" fluke 8:11). James 
stresses the function of the 
word (James 1:18-25). Luke. in 
Acts, shows that in every case 
of conversion (or "New Birth"). 
the Good News was preached 
and acted upon. 
Those who heard the .word 

preached (the product of the. 
Holy Spirit), believed: in God 
and in .lesus as his Son. 
repented (changed their love 
and practice with reference to 
sin) and were immersed 
(haptiied) in water (Acts 
2:36-38; 8:12; 8:35-39; 9:1-19 
10:34-48; 16:14-15; 16:29-34; 
17:22-34; 18:8.). Because water 

• 
baptism followed Gospel 
preaching. 	faith 	and 
repentance. in every case. it is 
-obvious that the water of John 
3:5 can refer in nothing else but 
this. 

• 
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Retirement 
Proofs Kincaid Real Estate 

629-1781 

100 South Seaman Eastland, Texas 

Houses And Residential 	Small Acreages 

BIG 
SELECTION 

OF 
BEDROOM 

SUITES 
STARTING AT 426.00 

• • • • 

Large 3 bedroom, 2 bath, home on a good sized lot in 
Eastland. Close to a stiLD1- in microwave, dish- 

	

waser, disposal, wash 	 up. Living room, dining 

	

19 room, Family room. 1 	 area. One car garage. 
' Come see us on this one. $22,500.00. 121/2  and 131/2  Ga. Dom. • 

• 

3 bedroom, 1 bath h 
car garage- close to 	

iond- 1200' of living area- 1 
)spital- small assumable 

loan or refinance- 	 and need to sell- $8495.00 

3 bedroom 1 bath home in Cisco- extra lots- nice sandy 
garden spot- workshop, hot house- 1200 square feet living 
area- nice fruit and shade trees. Ideal for young growing 
family or retired couple. $12,600. 

Barb Wire 
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Pictures* '44,:ti3/4,-„,.....notre 
5 Panel Steel Gates 

• 1$19.95• Also • 
Steel, Half Wire Gates 

According to Glyn Hammons, 
manager of the Abilene Social 
Security office, this is a busy 
lime of year because many 
people choose the early part of 
the year to retire and file for 
Social Security retirement 
benefits. Many unnecessary 
delays in receiving benefits can 
be avoided by bringing all 
necessary 	proofs 	and 
documents to the Social 
Security office when filing the 
original application. 

Several items are nearly 
always necessary for the 
prompt 	processing 	of 
retirement applications. These 
are last year's W- 2 forms or 
tax return if self- employed in 
order to be credited with prior 
year's work and earnings. 
military discharge papers for 
those who have been in the 
armed forces, and proofs of 
age. 

Proof of age can consist 
 4. 

various types of documer 
The most preferable is a birth 
or baptismal certificate 
recorded before age five. Other 
things which.  can  he  used to 
prove a ge are delayed birth 
certificates. family Bibles. 
school or census records. 
children's birth certificates, 
insurance policies, or other 
documents at least five years 
old that show age or date of 
!sir h. 

If a spouse will also i;" ap-
plying for benefits. the h ye 
documents should he brought 
for that person. 

Children of the retiring 
worker may also be eligible for 
benefits if they are under 18 
years of age. or full- time 
students. or were handicapped 
before age 22. For these 
children. their birth cer-
tificates should be brought 
when applying as well as school 
information for students and 
t-odical information for 
natidicapped children over age 
18. 

If the person filing, for 
retirement benefits will bring 
as much of a necessary in- 
formation and documentation 
as possible to the initial in- 
terview. his claim can be 
processed more promptly and 
benefits received more quickly. 

If you have any questions 
concerning what to bring in to 
file your retirement ap-
plication. phone 698- 1360. 

14•WI • • ININ111.01111111.111 • • MI)  

24 as. W. of Gorman, creek, trees $450. a. 
25 as. W. of Gorman, 12  in cult., $460.a. 
30 as. N. of Eastland, trees, G.1. $500.a. 
30 as. NW of Eastland, cult., tank $375.a. 
40 as. W of Gorman, 10 percent down, own. fin. $400.a. 
73 as. W of Gorman, biway 6 frontage $400.a. 
63 as. S. of Cisco, sandy land $350.a. 
58 as. and lg. home, Lampasas Co. $650.a. 
68 as. sandy cult., 20 a. peanuts $400.a. 
70 as. S. of Cisco, all cult. $350.a. 
70 as. NW of Eastland, home sites $350.a. 
73 as. lg. house & barn S. of Cisco $465.a. 
76 acs., good hunting Jack Co. $350.a. 
80 acs. & house W of Eastland $400.a. 
99 acs., trees, hunting. Hamilton Co. $350.a. 
100 acs. S. of Eastland, coastal & love $420.a. 
100 acs. E of Gorman, peanut place $640.a. 
100 acs. S of Cisco, trees & tank $320.a. 
112 acs., Lingleville, pavement & trees $425.a. 
122 acs., creek, deer hunting, barn $325.a. 
136 acs. SW of Cisco, house, cult. $320.a 

3 bedroom, 2 bath home in Eastland- large living room- 
central heat a 	dishwasher, disposal, washer- dryer 
hookup- 1470' living area, carpeted throughout except kit-
chen and dining rocim. Nice interior and close to hospital and 
school. Owner moving. $18,000. 

3 bedroom 2 bath brick home in Eastland. Central heat and 
air, fully carpeted. built- in dishwasher, disposal, oven, 
washer- dryer hook- up. enclosed 2 car garage, and 1240' 
living area with fireplace. It's total electric. $31,500. 

Larger Tracts 
2 bedroom home south of Cisco. Approximately 6 acres 

land, fruit trees, good garden area, coastal bermuda, fenced 
and cross fences, good barns, well, community water, 2 car 
garage. A nice retirement place. $16,000. 

231 acs. of good pasture on pavement NW of Eastland with 
barn, 2 tanks, fenced, several nice building sites. $350 an ac. 

2 bedroom home 
acres of land with' 
cultivation, panelei 
room, large sizec 
available. $18,000. 

in Marton Valley on approximately 3 

SOLD 
ige, city water, well, 12 in 
chen, living room, dining 
some owner financing 

3 bedroom new brick home inEastland. Living room, 
dining room, all bu en, D  dryer hook- up, beautiful 
location, central 	 I living area, and 2 car 
garage. All this L. 

7,5 acres on Highway 80 east in Eastland. Includes 400' 
frontage, 2 mobile homes, 1 office building, excellent location 
for any business or mobile home park with assumable loan. 
$51,400. 

Business building close to down' town and hospital in 
Eastland. Good sized lot ideal for office building or rental 
property 4400'. Has several possibilities. Invest at $50,000. 

Eddie Kincaid 

629-8100 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 

307 acs. at Carbon. All in cult., fine 3 br brick home, new 
barn and workshop, pavement frontage, city water and 
wells, 130 acs. peanut allotment, and 5- 12 minerals. Well 
improved place. $625. an acre. 

426 acs. on Sabanna River, no wasteland, place is all in 
either coastal or love grass. 300 gallons, minute water well, 
irrigation system. 24 acs. in peanuts, and 14  minerals. Would 
consider splitting. 5375 an ac. 

662 acs. in Stephens Co., hiway frontage. creek bottoms, 3 
houses, city water, proven coal deposit. deer hunting and 
owner financing. $300 an ac. 

NICE 3 BP brick home on 28 acres of prime land in edge of 
Cross Plains. 2400 feet of living area- enclosed 2 car garage-
dishwasher disposal- fireplace. Over 100 pecan and fruit 
trees- Subdivision possibilities. See to appreciate. 
$110,000.00. 

WE WOULD APPRECIATE LISTINGS ON ALL TYPES 
OF PROPERTY. WE HAVE NUMEROUS LISTINGS IN 
THE AREA, SO COME BY AND VISIT WITH US FOR ANY 
OF YOUR REALTY NEEDS. 18 FRIENDLY LOCATIONS TO SERVE YOU 

Robert Kincaid 

629-2815 Rising Star 



Our business is custom photo services 

Reproduction Custom Color 

We don't want to do all of your 
color processing... 

...We just want to do those special jobs 
where quality is the most important factor. Send your 
color negatives and get back the best prints they 
will produce. 

Have a favorite color slide? You can have a full-
color print from that too. 

(custom  
'\. 7 raphics 

P. 0. Box 124 
Ranger, Texas 76470 

Phone: 647.1330 

RISING STAR HIGH SCHOOL 
1977 Boys and Girls TRACK SCHEDULE 

DATE 
Feb. 26th 
March 4th 
March 11th 
March 12th 
March 18th 
March 19th 
March 25th 
April 1st & 2nd 
April 2nd 
April 14th 
April 15th 
April 22nd 
April 23rd 
April 30th 
May 6th & 7th 
May 13th & 14th 

BOYS OR GIRLS 
Girls 
Boys and girls 
Boys 
Boys and Girls 
Girls 
Boys 
Boys and Girls 
Girls 
Boys 
Girls 
Boys 
Boys 
Girls 
Boys 
Girls 
Boys 

Location 
Abilene 
Santa Anna 
Ranger 
Lometa 
Mason 
Rochelle 
Wildcat Relays- Rising Star 
Texas Relays- Austin 
Gordon 
District Meet- Rising Star 
District Meet- Ranger 
Regional Qualifers Meet- Rising Star 
Regional Meet- Brownwood 
Regional Meet- Brownwood 
State Meet- Austin 
State Meet- Austin 

SAFETY .: 
SAMPLER 

ar ibatteries can 
explode ..... 

r  I O , 0  @e people 
ended up in emergency 

rooms last year froni 
batte 	accidents° 

113e 
very 

carthl 
FI^ to 	star in9 cars° 
Don't try to jump start 

frozen batteryoo° 
ever cross poles or 

moke when working 
near a battery° oco 
for 	information 

battery Safely. write; 
IA a Cgnswmer B-odwet 

Safety Commission 
Washineon, D.C. 20207 

or alltoll-free 
00Q-638-266e 

Maryland residents only 
cal1800-492-2937 ISR 

Sentiment Is -The poetry of Lhe imagination. 

Eastland 
	

629-1220 

Thurs.-Fri.-Sat. 7:30 p.m. 

It takes a man 
with a heart 

as big as Texas 
to fill 

Mr. Billion's boots... 

A billion dollar cross-country chase 
where the nice guys finish first for a change. 

TWENTIETH CENTUR Y FOX Prneris TERENCE HILL • VALERIE PERRINE . MN BILLION 
A PANTHEON FICTURES KAPLAN FRIEDMAN PRODUCTION • SLIM PICKENS • WILUAM REDFIELD • CHILL W7LLS 

and JACIOE GLEASON at Cot • Executree Produce GABRIEL KAT21(A -Produced by STEVEN BACH 6rd KEN FRIEDMAN 
CoProducef SHELDON SCHRAGER • Dented ts JONATHAN KAPLAN -W4/en by KEN FRIEDMAN and JONATHAN KAPLAN 

MAR DAVE GRUSIN -COLOR BY DE IOKI • 

PARENTAL GUIDANCE SUGGEMD 
SOME MA1EINA1 mAr NOT BE cx•  

sunweLE FOP KAE•TEENAGERS [PG 
un.-Mon.-Tues. 7:30 

"DRUM" IS THE 
EXPLOSION! 

*Edda 
n 	I/  

"URUM th,,,WARREN OATES • ISF1A YEGA • KEN NORTON • PAM GRIER 
enstunrq 

YANET KOTTO . JOHN COLICOS ROTA LEWIS  • PAULA KELLY . BRENDA snesuuma 
Pips:sof RALPH B. SERPE (sees NSIEVE CARVER sums, in  NORMAN WEXLER mail 0, tami &,101E NKr 

II] 	 aux carom:lot WESMALLS 	United Arbsts 

PEOPLE 
fathers. Friends. 
Mothers. Brothers 
and sisters. And 

nothing or no one can take their place. 
They're special. 

Special people have special needs, too. No 
one else is in exactly the same situation at the 
same time. And no one else has exactly the 
same dreams. 

Come see us and pull up a friendly chair. Or 
call and we'll come see you. We can help you 
with your special needs and your special 
dreams . . . in so many ways. And we will! 
Together, we can make the right things happen. 
For you. For your family. For your 
business. To us, people are 

WORTH A 
LOT MORE 
THAN 
MONEY. 

ORANGER 
SAVINGS 

di\  i.inn n1 ( 	Saving. 

	 EASTLAND 
SAVINGS 

A division of Olney Savings 

Peanut Industry 
Leaders Review 

-1 

Sipe Springs 
News 

BY MRS. JACK MILLWEE 

t 	  

IPERS011ALSj  
Thursday, March 24, 1977 

Leonard in Gorman Sund. also 
paid a visit to, Mr. Jeff Price in 
the Gorman hospital we hope 
for him a speedy recovery. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Millwee 
spent Sun. with her parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Layne Cotter in Baird. 

Mrs. Joy Harris, Jackie and 
Brandi visited her sister. Mrs. 
Nancy Hooten and family in Ft. 
Worth over the weekend. 

Personals 
Capt. and Mrs. Jerry Darr and 

boys Steven and Jason were 
weekend visitors of her parents. 
Mr. and Mrs. A.J. Butler. 

. 	. 
Mr. and Mrs Wayne Johnston 

of Gustine spent Sunday with 
Mrs. Mimmie Hou..er. 

Manon Cox is a patient in the 
Eastland Hospital. 

Sympathy is extended to the 
Randy Wynne family in the loss 
of their new born. March 14th in 
Woodson Oklahoma. This is the 
first great-grandchild of Mrs. 
Charlie (Dehilia) Walker. 

Those visiting and helping 
the Walter Hastings celebrate 
their 50th anniversary were: Bill 
and Stella Levesy of Seagraves 
and John and Mary Greves of 
Waco. 

Mrs. Ruby 1:t) cell is home 
after spending a cek with her 
sons in Arlington. 

Mrs. Ruby Boswell and Mae 
Leonard attended the Hollidays 
on Ice in Abilene Sat. with the 
De Leon 65 Club. Mrs. Kenita 
Rainer also attended. 

The B.A. Petzel's and the 
Everette Harris's journeyed to 
Stephenville Sunday afternoon. 

Mrs. Conova Weaver has the 
misfortune of falling and 
injuring the muscle in her right 
leg. We hope for her a speedy 
recovery. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Chrishum 
Lubbock visited the T.A. 
Weaver Sunday. Mrs. Corie 
Weaver of Dallas are also 
visiting in the Weaver home. 

Mrs. Jack Millwee 

Chuck and Cauline 
Cannistracy.of Cisco and Diane 
Ripley of DeLeon spent the 
weekend in the Jack Millwee 
home. 

Mrs. Mary Tucker, who is an 
Aunt of Myrtle Owen passed 
away in Brownwood last week 
following a lengthy illness. I 

Mr. and Mrs. Terry Geye and 
children of Clyde were weekend 
visitors of Mr. and Mrs. H.L. 
Geye and Mrs. Helen Donham. 

Work was received of the 
death of Mr. H.A. Aldridge. 
who is a brother-in-law of Mr. 
O.L. Burns. He passed away 
Monday. March 21st in an 
Odessa Hospital. 	Mr. 
Aldridge's wife is the former 
Mary Burns of Rising Star. 

Lee Byrd is a patient in the 
Ranger Hospital. 

A-c Ray Darnell who is 
stationed at Goodfellow Air 
Force Base in San Angelo spent 
the weekend visiting his 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Raleigh 
Darnell. 

Saturday Club Hears 
Mayor Candidates 

Mrs. June Morris of Abilene 
visited her brother David Jones 
Sunday. 

Jackie Bibby has been 
released from the Brownwood 
Community Hospital following 
hospitalization for a snake bite 
received in the Jaycee 
Rattlesnake Rounduop in the 
Brownwood Colesium this past 
weekend. 

Mr. James McKochan of 
Abilene spent sat. with his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Quilla 
McKeehan. 

Mr. and Mrs. N.L. Leonard 
visited Mrs. Georeic and Jonell 

will be the measurement system 
we will use-we are wondering if 
it won't be difficult for us to 
change from our old method. "a 
little of this and a little of that," 
or a cup full or table spoonful. 

After the slides we had a short 
business session. 	Fifteen 
members answered to roll call, 
with three visitors Mrs. Frank 
Jacobs. Mrs. James Rutherford 
and Mrs. Jack Thomas. 
Delicious refreshments were 
served by the hostesses chicken 
and cheese sandwiches with 
pickles and cheese twists also 
fruit nut bars with coffee. 
The table was beautiful 

covered with a lace cloth 
centered with a vase of 
flowering almond and Japonica. 

The Club will meet again 
April 6th with Mrs. E. B. 
McCollum as hostess and. Mrs. 
Carl. Marsh as program 
Chairman. 

Mrs. Horace White and Miss 
Elizabeth Robertson were 
hostesses for the saturday club 
March 16th. 
In the abscence of the program 

chairman Mrs. Ed Witt. 
preSident, introduced the 
speakers. They were Mr. John 
Lee and Mr. W.G. Reed who 
are candidates for Mayor of our 
town. They each made a good 
talk and promise to give our city 
their time and support if 
elected. We appreciated their 
willingness to come and give us 
their ideas on what they think 
our town needs. The president 
thanked them for coming after 
the candidates made their talk. 
we had another speaker on the 
program. 
Mrs. Jack Thomas from the 

Extension department of 
Eastland made a talk and 
showed slides on the Metric 
system to be used in the kitchen 
she says in the near future this 

SAN ANTONIO, March 16-• - 
(Sp1)...Key leaders of the 
Texas peanut industry met in 
San Antonio Friday (March 4) 
to review progress being made 
in peanut annual research and 
education activities. 

Members of the Texas 
Peanut Producers Board heard 
major peanut program ac-
complishements from scien-
tists with the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment 
Station and specialists with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service who work with the 
state's peanut industry. The 
Board provides annual grant 
funds that are supplemental to 
those provided by the Ex-
periment Station and Extension 
Service for research and 
demonstration work with 
peanuts, explained Wendell 
Sellers of Floresville, board 
chairman. 

On hand to present progress 
reports of peanut project work 
were about 25 scientists with 
the Experiment Station and 
more than a dozen Extension 
Service specialists who are 
headquartered at College 
Station, 	Yoakum 	and 
Stephenville. Dr. Olin Smith, 
associate professor of peanut 
breding with the Experiment 
Station, and Dr. Leland D. 
Tripp, Extension agronomist 
for peanuts and oilseed crops, 
were conference coordinators. 

Besides Chairman Sellers, 
other members of the Peanut 
Producers Board include Dick 
Palmore of Dublin, Billy Heiser 
of Pearsall, Steve Ridgeway of 
Pleasanton, J.O. Jackson, Jr., 
of Gorman, J.N. Pruitt of 
Mineral Wells, Bill Huff of 
Grapeland, Billy Carruth of 
DeLeon, and Lyndell Coan of 
DeLeon. Wayne Eaves of 
Gorman, executive secretary 
of the Peanut Producers Board, 
moderated the program. 

Advisoty Committee 
members who assist the Board 
include Earl Behrens of 
Mason; 	Calvin 	Felts, 
Telephone; Robert Jameson, 
Seminole; 	Carl 	Miller, 
Brookshire, and Ronnie Sells of 
Giddings. 

Progress reports on projects 

now underway were presented 
in consumer marketing, peanut 
utilization, featuring the 
blendng of peanuts and milk 
proteins for cheese; nitrogen 
fixation progress, production 
demonstrations; work progress 
in harvesting, and a grower 
information series containing 
five compone ntS, including 
Southern blight, Segregation 
III peanuts, fungicide ap-
plication, weather monititoring 
and plant parasites. 

Other progress reports were 
given on the outlook for new 
breeding materials that are 
resistant to peanut diseases, 
screening for new germ plasm 
for disease resistance, and 
advances in insect and weed 
control project and demon-
stration work. 

Among new areas for 
research and demonstration 
potentials were research on 
freeze damage to peanuts as a 
result of the recent severe 
winter, expansion of insect 
control projects, work on 
maturation of peanuts, new 
aspects of foliar (leaf) fer-
tilization, interaction effects of 
soil nutrition on soil borne 
diseases, and disease control 
demonstrations based on the 
use of infrared photography. 

Presenting progress reports 
were Texas Agricultural Ex-
periment Station scientists Dr. 
J.P. N idiots, Dr. Karl Mattil, 
Dr. R.W.Weaver, Dr. J.W. 
Smith, Dr. T.E. Boswell, Dr. 
D.H. Smith, Dr. B.L. Jones, Dr. 
R.E. Pettit and Dr. O.D. Smith, 
while requests for new 
research potentials were 
presented by Dr. IN.K. Person, 
Dr. A.M Schubert, Dr. R.M. 
Jones and Dr. B.L. Jones. 

Texas Agricultural Ex-
tension Service specialists who 
presented progress reports 
were Dr. Tripp, Dr. C. Wendell 
Horne and Dr. Thomas A. Lee, 
Jr., Ben R. Spears, former 
Extension agronomist, now 
retired, reported on progress 
being made on a peanut har-
vester digger that he has 
designed. New potentials for 
penut demonstration work 
were outlined by Dr. Horne and 
Dr. Lee. 

Telephone Companies 
Testify At Senate Hearings Majestic Theatre 

DALLAS, TEXAS- March 18, 
1977- - The 	nation's 	In- 
dependent telephone com-
panies will return.  to Congress 
this month to testify at Senate 
hearings on an issue which the 
telephone industry considers a 
major threat to the low cost 
basic phone service now being 
provided to consumers. 

"Hearings on the future of 
telecommunicat ions, in-
cluding the impact of Federal 
Communications Commission 
poliCies fostering so- called 
competition, have been set by 
the Senate communications 
sub- committee for 	late 
Mar ch," James F. Miles. 
President of Continental 
Telephone Company of Texas. 
said. 

Wilson B. Garnett, President 
of 	the U.S. I ndependei: 
Telephone Association, will 
testify March 28 on behalf of 
Independent phone companies 
and customers. Other wit-
nesses will include Paul II. 
Henson, Chairman of the 
United Telecommunications, 
Inc., one of the largest non- 

Bell System holding. 
companies. and R.G. Nehring. 
President of Arizona Telephone 
Co.. a small company serving 
less thann 000 people. 

USITA I s a national trade 
group which represents the 
interests of the 1.600 non- Bell 
System companies. 

Independent 	(non- Bell) 
telephone companies serve 
over 28 million telephones in 
more than half of the nation's 
telephone territory, and 
Continental Telephone Com-
pany of Texas serves ap-
proximately 143,330 telephones 
in 176 exchanges. 

The Senate testimony follows 
three days of House hearings 
last September into the issue of 
so- called competition in 
communications. The industry 
states that recent d ecisions by 

the Federal communications 
Commission w di cause higher 
rates foir residential and small 
business users, and therefore 
are not in the public interest. 
The FCC has permitted 
customers to own their own 
telephone equipment. and has 
allowed non- telephone com-
panies to provide intercity 
communications services to 
business firms. 

"Last year. the whole 
telephone industry supported 
the principles behind the 
Consumer Communications 
Reform Act. which nearly 200 
Representatives and Senators 
co• sponsored. to encourage 
Congress to review national 
communications policy.-  Miles 
stated. "The same legislations 
has been reintroduce,(! in this 
Congress and already nas over 
50 sponsors- •- more than at the 
comparable times in the last 
session." 

"Objective outside studies 
don e for VISTA indicate the 
FCC policies will cause rate 
increases up to 60 per cent 
(excluding inflation) by 1985 for 
basic resident) 11. rural and 
small business service." he 
said. "That is why we are 
particularly pleased to see the 
Senate joining the House in 
reviewing this issue.'' 

"The telephone companies 
could successfully meet 
competition. but to do so we 
would have to change our 
pricing structure so that each 
type of customer would be 
charged according to the costs 
of providing his type of service. 
This inevitably wduld mean 
higher rates for residential 
consumers. whose rates pur-
posely have been kept low to 
meet the objectives of the 
Communications Act of 1934," 
Miles stated. That legislation 
called for low cost, widespread 
telephone service for all 
Americans. 

Heart Diseases 
You can live without it. 

Give Heart Fund 
American Heart Association 

American Heart Association 
To Conduct Canvas 

The American Heart 
Association will be conducting 
this Thursday, Friday and 
Saturday a house to house 
canvas of Rising Star. 

Mrs. Wanda Hughes is 
chairperson for this ( encasing. 

Your future health may well 
depend upon what you give. 
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Wildcat Tales 

..Pam Hill 
Senior Class  	 .Pam Cook 
Junior Class 	 Diana Linney 
Sophomore Class 	 Kirk Rust 
Freshman Class 	 Carla Bowers;  Pam Ratliff 
Boys Sports 	• 
Girls Sports 	 Jeanne Hounsel 
FFA- With the Farm Hand 	 Gary Fox 
FHA- Toward New Horizons 	Marilyn Wilson 
Annual Staff 	 Becky Wilson 
Student Council     Sharon McGinnis 
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Hey Gang, 

Come On Out To 
Andy Land And Help 
Us Celebrate Our 

Grand Opening 

Andy Clown Has Free 

Prizes For All The Kids 

Yours And Old. 

`Great Taste, Food Fast" 
Interstate 20 East 

New Rules For 
Earned Income 

Thursday, March 24, 1977 

David Harting And Deane 
Ballard Speak To AARP 

Honor Roll Announced 
At May Schools 

what each member liked to do 
best. 
Plans are being made for the 

next meeting at which time 
there will be a covered dish 
luncheon. The date for the 
meeting is Thursday. March 
24th at 11:30 a.m. Brother Dick 
Williams. of the First Baptist 
Church will be the guest 
speaker. 
Quilting is scheduled to begin 

at 	this 	session. 

Sherman. 
Thayne 

tell you how everything turned 
out. 

Studying to Win 
Pam 

Junior News 
Hi! Have you heard the latest 

romance. I have been doing 
sonic undercover work lately at 
J&S. and have discovered some 
very interesting facts. I found 
out RK and P. Lawrence have 
been carrying on in the bologna 
section. They are planning to 
buy out J&S. and make it R&D 
and sons and daughters and 
inbetweens. Thats it. 

Diana 

Our thanks to those who 
contributed to our needs: Mr. 
Bill Reed. Mrs. Detta Webb, 
Mrs. Dora Parent. the Boy 
Scouts. West Texas Utilities. 
Mrs. Breeding and Mr. Geye 
and the Ag. Boys for helping 
move these things. 
Anyone 	 needing 

transportation may call these 
numbers: 643-3731; 643-3347: 
643-4751. 

Refreshments were served by 
Mrs. Margaret Livingston. 
Mary Harper and Edie 
Anderson. 
A prayer was led, by Mr. G.E. 

McDonald. 
Games and a lesson on 

macrame were led by Detta 
Webb. A good time was had by 
all. Come join us next 
Thursday. 

Retired people of Rising Star 
affiliated with the AARP 
American 17th at 2:00 p.m. in 
their location with twenty 
members and three visitor's 
present. 
The group was called to order 

by Mr. Velma Turner. 
president. 

Two 	speakers 	were 
introduced to these assembled. 
David Harting and Deane 
Ballard from Waco who are with 
the Texas Green Thumb 
Division of the Texas AARP. 
They spoke on the work of the 
AARP. 
Mrs. Ruth Smith then gave a 

more detailed outline of the 
guidelines the organization. (1) 
Activities: games. crafts, art 
and music (2) Persoanl growth. 
studs groups. sewing. cooking. 
pers..nal and nutritional needs; 
(3) Broadening Horizons, Tour 
groups and educational films (4) 
Personal service: transportation 
plp-mc calls, to those in need. (5) 
Mulicines from AARP, Legal 
into! mation. Social Security 
benefits, financial advise and 
self help. (6) Community 
service; (7) History of Rising 
Star; (8) Museum and Library 
(9) and Facing the problem of 
aging. 

Roll call was answered by 

4-H Contests To Be Held 

Everyone has been super busy 
this week. Besides the 
events, all the banquets seem to 
he going on at the same time. 
There arc also track meets. the 
building of the new concession. 
and the student council is 
involved in repairing the press 
box. Both the FHA and the 
Junior-Senior banquet are to be 
this week. The FHA banquet is 
to be for both the FHA'crs and 
parents. I am really looking 
forward to the Junior-Senior 
banquet. It will be a change 
being honored for a night. The 
Rising Star Invitational Track 
meet is to be this Friday. With 
all the rush. rush of preparing 
for banquets and tracks meets 

the flu hug has had a chance t 
move in: and it has. It seems 
like everyone has a case of it. 
Well, that's about it for this 
week. Hope you have a nice 

day. 
Pam 

WHAT OF THE JEW? 
COMPOSED BY 
LAURA WALKER 

3.20-77 
Oh, ye gentile of today 

Know ye not what the Master 
will say 
If to one of His little ones, the 

Jew 
You have turned away? 
These words of Rebuke, on 

that day you will hear 
Depart from me, ye wicked 
Into Everlasting torment 
Where the devil and his angels 

were meant. 
So sing oh Israel, ye chosen ye 

blessed 
Bow low, low, as you worship 

your great King 
Worship ,your Jehovah, make 

glad in yotkr heart 
And His tear Son, whose 

mission is do e. 
Yes, He finished His mission 

When he died on the Cross 
Between Heaven and Earth 

Baring all our sins and dross. 
Some think the Jew is queer 

and cradty as can be 
They think they'll never reach 

Eternity 
Any Bible tells me plain. with 

Christ again they'll reign 
If only they'll witness His 

name. 
Weep, oh Israel. ye chosen. >c 

blessed 
I bringeth Deliverence. I 

bringcth thee rest 
Your enemies and foes from 

my wrath all will flee. 
You'll reign with me, 

Eternally. 
Rejoice. oh Israel, ye chosen 

ye blessed 
I'll smite with my rod, and my 

staff, you will see 
Then I'll reign as your King 
forever and ever 
In a land where there will be 

both Jews and Gentiles 
together. 

Dedicated to all 
Churches 

"IN the fish Bowl" 
This week has been a very 

busy one here at the ole high 
school. the 22nd we have a FHA 
banquet, the 25 a track meet. 
Also coming up is UIL on the 
28th and 29th. Everybody is 
studying to beat Gorman this 
year. Well next week we will 

RISING STAR CEMETERY 
ASSOCI NTION 

We thank the following for 
memorials given to our 
cemetery: 

PERMANENT FUND 
Memorials to Mrs. Irene 

Vermilion 
B.M. Carroll, Abilene, Texas 

$20.00 
R.J. White 5.00 
Joyce Anderson, Arlington, 

Texas 8.00 
Charlene Flemming 50.00 

March 25th. 7:30 p.m. the 
Eastland County 4- H Contests 
will be held at the Cisco High 
School Auditorium. 

Now, you might ask, just 
what kind of contest is this? 9-
Hers (indivudual or a team or 
two) prepare a Method 
Demonstration in some area of 
4- H in which they are in-
terested. These can range from 
peanut production, to child 
abuse, to safety tips for a trip. 
In the demonstration, they 
actually show how to do 
something or explain how to do 
others. For instance: in a hand 
skills demonstration on cake 
decortating, a 4- Her would 
actually use icing use icing to 

make decorations for a cake 
while explaining steps in 
preparation. 

Much work is put into these 
de mristrations. 4- Hers must 
gather material, then prepare 
their t a lk outline, and actudlly 
learn to do the demonstration. 

Most talks are limited to 12 
minutes and can be junior (9-
14) or senior (14- 19) 4- H 
member s. There are 26 
demonstrations areas possible. 

If a demonstration wins at 
the County level, it proceeds to 
district competition on April 23. 
Then district winning seniors 
attend the State 4- H Round-
Up. June 7- 9 at College 
Station. 

4th Six Weeks 
"A" Students 

Seniors: Patrick Sherman, 
Jerry Newman, Karla Murdock, 
Beth Chambers, Bonnie 
Buchanan, Phil Mitchell, Tanya 
Allen, Linda Stewart, 
Juniors: Dana Burnett, Noma 

Fowler. Debbie Hart, Brian 
Holmes. Lone Palmore, Dawn 
Stewart. Carla Thornhill. 
Sophomores: Sue Newman. 

Janet Nelson, Ted Murphree, 
Pam Mitchell. 
Freshmen: 	Susan 

Schwekzberger, Becky 
Windham. 
Eithth Grade: Dawn 

David Newman. 
Pittman. 
Seventh grade: Benny 

Edwards. 
Sixth 	Grade: 	Darrin 

Chambers. Carol Engle. Dianne 
Mitchell, Yvonne Petross, Lynn 
Whiteaker, Shellon McCallie. 
Fifth Grade: Shanc t nation. 
Fourth Grade:Terty Ritrnen. 

Cathy Engle. Cathy Petross, 
Glen Pittman. 
Third Grade: Debbie Burnett. 

Lode Chambers. Crysal Moore. 
Larry Owings. 

"B" Students 
Seniors: Paul Musick. Teresa 

Burnett. Doug Morton. Judy 
Anderson. 
Juniors Joel Kelton. Robert 

Windham. 
Sophomores: Becky Moore, 

Johnny Jackson, Jimmy 
Harrell. 
Freshman: Bo Allen. Kenny 

Hignight. 
Eighth Grade: Gary Jackson. 
Seventh Grade: Mike 

Cogburn, Tonja Crafton. Jamie 
Epley. Perry Ellis. Tracey 
Hammer. 
Sixth Grade: Barbara Bowden. 

Brenda Bowden, Kenny 
Buchanan, Becky Bundick, 
Debra Pittman. 

Fifth Grade: Bobby Burnett. 
Linda Harris, Jeff Stewart. 
Esther Costilla. 
Fourth Grade: Mona Allredge, 

Melissa Norris. Richard 
Windham. 
Third Grade: Kelly Hammer, 
Jenifer Strickland. Hoahn 
Ingram. Aaron McCallie. 
Second Grade: Robert 

Bowden, Karen Pittman, Jerry 
Harris. 
First 	Grade: 	Wayne 

Chambers, Wayne Chambers, 
Tammie Hardy. Patrick Ellis. 

2nd Semester 
"A" Students 

Seniors: Patrick Sherman, 
Jerry Newman. Karla 
Murdock, Beth Chambers, 
Bonnie Buchanan, Phil 
Mitchell, Tanya Allen. Linda 
Stewart. 
Juniors: Dana Burnett, Noma 

Fowler, Debbie Hart, Lode 
Palmore, Carla Thornhill. 
Sophomores: Sue Newman, 

Ted Murphree, Pam Mitchell. 
Freshman: 	Susan 

Schweitzberger. Becky 
Windham. 
Eight Grade: Dawn Sherman, 

David Newman. Thayne 
Pittman. 
Seventh Grade: Benny 

Edwards. Jamie Eple 
Sixth 	Grade: 	Lynne 

Whiteaker, Yvonne Petross, 
Diane Mitchell, Carol engle, 
Darrin Chambers. 
Fifth Grade: Cathy Engle, 

Cathy Petross, Glenn Pittman. 
Third Grade: Debbie Burnett. 

Crissy Moore. Larry Owings. 
"8" Students 

Seniors: Bobby Driskill. Paul 
Musick. Teresa Burnett. doug 
Morton. Judy Anderson. 
Juniors: Foel Kelton. Dawn 

Stewart, Robert Windham. 
Sophomores: Janet Nelson, 

Becky Moore. Johny Jackson, 
Jimmy Harrell. 
Freshmen: Bo Allen. Kenny 

Hignight. 
Eighth Grade: Gary Jackson. 
Seventh Grade: Mike 

Cogburn, Tonja Crafton, Gina 
Miller. Vicki Mann. 
Sixth Grade: Debra Pittman. 

Shelton McCallie. Becky 
Bundick, Brenda Bowden. 
Barbara Bowden. 
Fifth Grade: Esther Castilla. 

Linda Harris. Jeff Stewart. 
Fourth Grade: Terry Burnett. 

Mona Attridge. Melissa Norris. 
Ricky Wells, Richard Windham. 
Third Grade: Kelly Hammer. 

Jenifer Strickland, Hoahn 
Ingram, Aaron McCallie. 
Second Grade: Jerry Harris. 
First Grade: Saronna Attridge. 

Tammy Hardy. 

Dallas- - New rules for 
claiming the earned income 
credit make more low income 
families eligible for the credit 
for 1976, the Internal Revenue 
Service today said. 

Since a number of persons 
overlooked this tax benefit last 
year, the IRS urged all tax-
payers to read the tax return 
instruction carefully to see if 
they qualify for the credit. 

The refundable credit, 
originally enacted by the 1975 
Tax Redution Act with rules 
liberalized by the 1976 Tax 
Reform Act, is available to 
qualifed taxpayers even if their 
incomes are not high enough to 
require them to file a return. 

To qualify for the earn rd 
income credit, the taxpayei s 
adjusted gross income or 
earned income, whichever is 
larger, must be less than $8,000. 
Earned income means wages, 
salaries, tips and other em-
ployee compensation as well as 
net earnings from self-
employment. 

In addition, the taxpayers 
must pay over half the cost of 
keeping up a home that is the 
principal residence for the 
entire year of the taxpayer an 
at least one of the taxpayer's 
children who is eightuen Ander 
age 19, a full- time student or is 
disabled. The home may be 
rented or owned by the tax-
payer. 

A major change made by the 
new law allows the credit to a 
taxpayer (• •en if the taxpayer is 
not entitled to claim a depen-
dem) ,:sern dim for their child 
under age 19 or a full- time 
student. However, the taxpayer 
must be able to claim their son 
or daughter as a dependent if 
the child is disabled and 19 or 
older. 

The name of the taxpayer's 
child who qualified the tax-
payer for the credit must be 
entered on the return. In ad-
dition, married taxpayers must 
file a joint return to claim the 
credit unless they meet the 
criteria for filing as Single or 
Unmarried Head of Household. 
If a joint return is filed, the 
$8,000 maximum income 
limitation is applied to the 
combined income of both 
spouses. 
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Your 
Hometown 
Newspaper 
What's so great about our local newspaper? 
Plenty!!! We offer so much more for YOU 
than any big city publication can possibly do. 
Sure they bring you the latest news. So do we! 
They'll tell you about current business trends and 
sports happenings. So do we! But when you're 
looking for the latest storewide bargains, the 
best restaurants, sports events, musical 
concerts, weather reports and countless other 
"local" things .. . those big city editions 
just can't complete! We're your "where-to-
find" index for just about everything in town. 
And we're right in your own backyard! 

A 

THE CABBAGE PATCH 
Susi Coody - Owner 

Here's a shop that specializes 
in just what every young 
mother has been looking 
for...quality clothing! 	The 
Cabbage Patch is located at 700 
West Walker in Breckenridge, 
phone 559- 3282, and they 
feature one of the area's finest 
selections of childrens clothing 
at prices that will allow you to 
change your child's wardrobe 

WORD OF LIFE BOOK 
& GIFT SHOP 

Fredonia "Doni" & Roger Sawyers - Owners he (or she) grows. 
At The Cabbage Patch they 

also carry Misses and Junior 
Petite sizes too. 

The editors of this 1977 
Consumers Message urge you 
this year to make it a point to 
shop at The Cabbage Patch, we 
know once you do, you'll make 
it a regular habit. 

as he (or she) grows! Bring 
your child in and look over the 
tremendous assortment of 
outstanding bargains in brand 
name apparel! 	You'll find 
exciting outfits from infants 
sizes thru 18. Many of the 
garments featured are cut so 
that they can be used for a 
longer period of time because 
they will fit a growing child as 

FEDERAL LAND BANK ASSOCIATION 
Randy Feaster - Manager 

S & W WELL SERVICE 
J.W. "Dub" West - Owner & Operator 

One of the area's leading 
Christian book stores is the 
Word Of Life Book & Gift Shop 
at 135 East Walker in 
Breckenridge, phone 559- 2142. 
Here you'll find everything in 
theological reading material 
from bibles to hymnals to 
historical reference texts and if 
they don't have what you're 
looking for, they can special 
order. 

A 	beautifully- bound 
presentation bible makes a gift 
of lasting love and remem-
berance. They also feature 

recordings of both music and 
scripture for all ages and 
there's something that's sure to 
delight everyone on your gift 
list. 

Stop in at the Word of Life 
Book & Gift Shop for all manner 
of religious books and goods. 
They offer free wrapping and 
mailing service and it's the 
perfect place to shop for a gift 
for that very special someone. 

The writers of this 1977 
Consumers Message are 
pleased to have a business of 
this quality listed in our review. 

The Federal Land Bank 
Association is located at 212 
North Rose in Breckenridge, 
phone 559- 2311. Here you will 
find loans for agricultural 
purposes, including long term 
farm or ranch land, or mor-
tgage credit. 

Through this widely known 
institution many people of this 
community have been enabled 

BOB PITZER REALTORS 
Bob Pitzer - Owner 

being imposed upon in any way. 
There can be no better way to 
secure funds for your 
agriculture needs than to visit 
the Federal Land Band 
Association. 

The editors of this 1977 
Consumers Message are proud 
to present this solid institution 
to our readers. 

to own their own farms and 
ranches. They have probably 
contributed as much toward the 
development of this community 
as any other institution. 	Its 
service is positively in-
dispensable to the success and 
progress of this section. 

They offer a way for farmers 
and ranchers to secure loans in 
'a business like manner, without 

power swivel, large mud-
pump for re- entry completion 
and re- completion. 

The writers of this 1977 
Consumers Message are 
pleased to be able to recom-
mend this outstanding com-
pany and we feel that YOUR oil 
projects will go a lot smoother 
with the S&W Well Service on 
the job! 

Dependable well service is 
always available 24 hours a day 
from this well known concern. 
Their crews and equipment are 
ready to go throughout the 
year, so you never need to wait 
when there's oil to find. Phone 
559- 5875 or drop by their of-
fices at 1210 West 5th in 
Breckenridge to discuss YOUR 
needs with the professionals! 
They offer reverse circulation, 

When you need qualified 
work on a new well site, an 
existing well that needs 
completing or an old one which 
requires a workover...call in 
the pros! The S&W Well Ser-
vice specializes in all types of 
oil well service including new 
wells, workovers and com-
pletions. Call them first, 
whenever you want the ab-
solute best service that's 
available. 

GAYLON'S BODY SHOP 
Gaylon Perrin - Owner 

Aubrey Prettyman & Lynn Beavers - Avto Body Technicians 

Bob Pitzer Realtors can and 
will find just what you're 
looking for. They have access 
to property throughout the 
state and can assist you in 
every conceivable manner. 
When it comes time to sell your 
existing property, this reliable 
broker will get more for you! 
Trust them with ALL of your 
real estate matters! 

DEUBLER ROUSTABOUT SERVICE 
Kathy a Randy Deubler - Owners 

People in the Breckenridge 
area don't have to look far and 
wide for a firm which is 
capable of doing the highest 
quality auto body work and 
painting. The Gaylon's Body 
Shop at 100 East First, for 24 
hour wrecker service, phone 
559- 3232, they can refinish and 
re- paint ANY car or domestic. 
Their work is well known as 

As the editors of. this 1977 
Consumers Message we 
heartily suggest that YOU see 
Bob Pitzer Realtors for ALL of 
your transactions. 

When you're looking around 
today's tough, critical real 
estate market for the best place 
to put your money, trust the 
Bob Pitzer Realtors to help you 
find the home or property that 
YOU want! 

With offices located at 700 
West Walker in Breckenridge, 
phone 559- 5480, this respected 
broker has more to offer in 
terms of listings and services. 
Whether you're looking for a 
new home, farms, ranches or 
lake lots...this is the one to see 
FIRST! 

With some realistic prices 
and some diligent effort, the 

do no better than to trust your 
car to the experienced pros at 
the Gaylon Body Shop! 

The editors of this 1977 
Consumers Message urge all of 
our readers to remember that 
most insurance companies now 
permit you to choose the body 
shop you like best. We suggest 
you choose this one ! 

CRENSHAW REFRIGERATION 
Richard "Dick" Crenshaw - Owner 

being fast, economical AND 
beautiful! 

When you bring your car to 
this outstanding body and paint 
shop, you can rest assured that 
the work will be done to your 
exact specifications and that 
the estimate will match the 
final statement. From a small 
crease to a roll- over, you can 

field construction, tank bat-
teries erected, pipeline work 
and winch truck service, they 
are fully insured for your 
protection. 

We, the editors of this 1977 
Consumers Message wish to 
commend the Deubler 
Roustabout Service and its 
owners for their outstanding 
service to this area and to the 
nation. 

BILL HAMILTON OIL FIELD 

CONSTRUCTION 
Family Owned & Operated - 

Joyce St BM Hamilton 

559- 9654. 
Like others of his business 

Deubler Roustabout Service 
spends his days helping find-
develop new sources of energy 
to meet todays ever- growing 
demands for top- quality 
petroleum products- - Deubler 
Roustabout Service is now 
expanding to include general 
pipe laying, up to 6 inch pipe, 
line call for details, 

Specializing in general oil 

The oil business can be a 
risky one- - a business in which 
fortunes are made and lost 
every day. But for every in-
dividual who has made a for-
tune or lost one- in a big oil 
gamble, there are thousands of 
smaller 	businessmen-
suppliers, drillers, seismic 
operators, 	geologists, 
engineers Deubler Roustabout 
Service located at 1703 East 
Walker in Breckenridge, phone 

MONTERREY HOUSE 
PEELER'S INC. 

"Bunny" b Wilke Earnest - Owners 

Ake & Richard Gilman - Owners 
Good oil field hands are hard 

to find. One of the best sources 
for qualified manpower to run 
your well is Bill Hamilton Oil 
Field Construction: 	t he 
"roustabout crew headquar-
ters!" 

Located at 309 South Newton 
Street in Breckenridge, phone 
559- 5872, this well known firm 
has men available 24 hours a 
day to help with any problems 
you may be having at your well 
sites. From setting pumping 
units to erecting tank batteries, 
run unit blocks, spray painting 
and winch truck service, 
there's the men YOU need 

carries the carrier air con-
ditioning units that you can set 
the thermostat for either 
heating or cooling and you have 
spring the whole year. 

If you have central furnace, 
you likely have half an air 
conditioning system already 
and do not realize it. Call for an 
estimate and let them furnish 
you with a personal survey with 
all the facts and figures. As 
editors of this 1977 Consumers 
Message we know you'll be glad 
you did. 

If you're contemplating 
hiring a contractor to do some 
work for you, stop a minute. 
Don't call just anyone in the 
phone book because you may 
like the looks of their ad. In the 
Breckenridge area, many 
knowledgeable people in the 
habit of calling ONLY the 
Crenshaw Refrigeration. 

Located on Highway 180, 
phone 559- 2598, this reliable 
concern has a history of rapid 
completions, well- done jobs 
and satisfied customers. 
Crenshaw Refrigeration 

Contrary to the belief that 
Mexican food is very hot, they 
serve all their dishes with chips 
and homemade hot sauce first 
on the side so that you can 
enjoy it the way you want. 

For a fine place to eat 
authentic Mexican food in the 
same atmosphere, and with 
friendly service, the writers of 
this 1977 Review suggest that 
you go to the Monterrey House. 
They are open Monday thru 
Saturday 11:00 a.m. to 2:00 
p.m. and 5:00 p.m. to 10:00 p.m. 
We know once you do, you'll 

make it a regular habit. 

HARRILL EARNEST 
UPHOLSTERY SHOP 

Harrill Earnest - Owner 
Peg Earnest - Manager 

For authentic Mexican food, 
the people of this area visit, the 

Monterrey House at 1401 East 
Walker in Breckenridge, phone 
559- 9158. 

Through the efforts of the 
management here to serve only 

the true Mexican dishes with a 
real flavor of the country, as 
well as interesting Mexican 
decor, this restaurant has 
become a very popular eating 
place. 

They have captured the true 
tangy flavor of the Mexican 
dishes by using the exact spices 
and foods to prepare them. 

WHEN you need them. All you 
have to do is call! 

The Bill Hamilton Oil Field 
Construction has complete 
roustabout crews ready to go on 
a moment's notice. Make this 
oil field "employment agency" 
your headquarters for 
roustabout crews, and your 
well will produce a little better 
with qualified personnel on the 
job! 

The editors of this Consumers 
Message for 1977 are happy to 
recommend Bill Hamilton Oil 
Field Construction to all of our 
readers. 

PAINT & NEEDLE 
Paula Kunkel - Owner 

GRIFFIN ELECTRIC 
Gaylon Griffin - Owner 

The modern business 
requires the very latest in 
automation to speed the work 
process and allow all systems 
to function smoothly. A great 
way to take a lot of the work out 
of 	those 	complicated 
"figuring" problem areas like 
bookkeeping, accounting and 
inventory sheets is to look into 
the many new and exciting 
calculators and adding 
machines 	offered 	by 

PEELER'S Inc.: 	your 
Victor. Sharp and Royal 
typewriter dealer. Located at 
219 West Walker, across from 
the 	courthouse 	in 
Breckenridge, phone 559- 3383 
for sales and service, this 
respected firm specializes in all 
types of modern business 

machines along with a com-
plete selection of office supplies 
and gifts. 

They have a full line of the 
very 	la test 	electronic 
calculators and adding 
machines on display. There's 
one that's just right for your 
office! 	Just call and their 
courteous "systems analyst", 
Chuck Lethcoe, the salesman in 
the area, will be happy to look 
over your operation and 
recommend the best machines 
for your particular needs. 
You're in good hands with the 
Peeler's Inc.! 

The editors of this 1977 
Consumers Message are 
pleased to be able to recom-
mend this outstanding concern 
to all of our readers..  

For qualified electrical work 
of the highest quality, many 
business men and homeowners 
in this area call Griffin Electric 
to be assured of a job well done! 

distinctly superior service. 
Many people do not realize that 
the furniture they now have 
may be of better construction 
than most new furniture. 
Upholstering those pieces is the 
best investment to be made. 

They have a complete line of 
upholstering fabrics to suit 
your choice. You can match 
any color scheme you desire at 
this upholstering shop. 

In this 1977 Review, we, the 
editors wish to commend the 
HARRILL EARNEST 
UPHOLSTERY SHOP upon the 
quality of their work and we 
recommend them to the people 
of this area. 

Specialists in all types of 
upholstery and heavy fabric 
work, the Harrill Earnest 
Upholstery Shop has become 
known throughout the area as 
being THE place to go when 
only best is good enough! 
Whether you want a couch and 
chair recovered, or a new seat 
of furniture repaired, this is the 
place to go! 

Located at 117 North 
Breckenridge in Breckenridge, 
phone 559- 2608. This firm has 
restored many valuable pieces 
of furniture to their original 
beauty. 

In the line of general 
upholstering and furniture 
repairing they render a 

a number of other creative 
pastimes...this is the place to 
go! They have one of the area's 
most complete assortments of 
materials and kits for most any 
hobby or craft. They'll even 
put you in touch with classes 
and professional instructors for 
your favorite hobby, and have 
custom work available. 

In compiling this 1977 Con-
sumers Message, we, the 
writers, would like to make 
special mention of the Paint & 
Needle. They have a store full 
of great ideas of fun things for 
you to do! 

TEXAS PRESS 
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their installations are up to the 
uniform standards set by city, 
county, state and federal 
electrical requirements. 
You're assured of having a 
perfectly safe, inspected job 
when the Griffin Electric does 
the work. No wonder many 
leading home builders specify 
this reliable firm for their new 
home wiring and installations! 

The editors of this 1977 
Consumers Message suggest 
that you contact the best for 
your next electrical problem. 

Conveniently located at 119 
East Elm in Breckenridge, 
phone 559- 5578 day or night, 
this firm has been serving the 
community for many years 
now and they're recognized as 
the "best men for the job!" 

They're fully versed in all of 
the latest building codes of the 
area. They make sure that 

Looking for something 
creative and FUN? Check out 
the great selection of craft 
supplies and kits available at 
the Paint & Needle! 	This 
outstanding shop is located at 
227 West Walker in 
Breckenridge, phone 559- 9523, 
and they're just waiting to show 
you the very latest in all kinds 
of fun things to do, and if they 
don't have what you're looking 
for, they can special order it for 
you. 

Whether you're interested in 
macrame, decoupage, bead-
work, candle making or any of 

EPLEY FLOOR 

COVERING 

REATHERFORD 

BACKHOE 
COMPANY Richard Epley - Owner 

Frankie C. Reatherford 

Owner 
If you're planning to have 

ANY excavating work done, 
call the Reatherford Backhoe 
Company located at 1102 South 
Miller in Breckenridge, phone 
559- 9616. This is one outfit that 
has the latest equipment to turn 
out an excellent job...no matter 
whether it requires air com-
pressor or air tools, or back hoe 
or front end loaders. 

This capable firm is noted for 
their "square deal" business 
policies. The prices are right 
and their fast, efficient service 
is guaranteed to please. 

Whether you're in need of 
excavating, hauling or septic 
tank 	systems...call 	the 
professionals today! As the 
writers of this 1977 Consumers 
Message we know that you'll 
like the service AND the 
quality of work you ALWAYS 
get from the Reatherford 
Backhoe Company! 

JIM'S WELL 
SERVICE 
Jim Boggess 

Owner St Operator 
Experience counts! • And 

experience is what the Jim's 
Well Service at 1209 West 
Lindsey in Breckenridge, 
phone 559- 2146 day or night, 
offers in the business of oil field 
service! From complete oil 
well servicing to power tongs 
for any size pipe, or rod and 
tubing service and sand 
pumping this is one company 
which specializes in providing 
the ultimate in quality oil field 
services to the industry. 
You're in good hands when this 
qualified icm is on the job! 

This respected firm has 
many satisfactory completions 
to their credit. They age the 
preferred service company of 
leading drilling businesses 
throughout the area. Where 
there's oil to be found, you'll 
find the Jim's Well Service 
doing the job! 

The writers of this 1977 
Consumers Message are 
pleased to he able to list this 
Jim's Well Service along with 
the other leading businessmen 
and oil men of the area. 

Name brand floor coverings 
at reasonable prices. That's 
what you'll find at Epley Floor 
Covering! Linoleum, carpeting 
and a host of other decorator 
ideas can be found in one 
convenient stop AND the prices 
that are reasonable! Stop in at 
909 North Shelton in 
Breckenridge, phone 559- 5573 
to find out more about their 
brand name beauty. 

If you need new floor 
covering for your home or 
place of business, call them for 
an estimate. They will be more 
than willing to help you in any 
way they can, including fur-
nishing expert installation that 
they guarantee to please you. 
Regardless of your particular 
situation...there's no better 
place to take care of all of your 
floor covering problems than 
the Epley Floor Covering! 

The editors of this 1977 
Consumers Message suggest 
that you contact this well-
known floor materials dealer at 
your earliest possible con-
vience, you'll he glad you did. 
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DR. PEPPER-PEPSI COLA BOTTLING RUST POCESSING CENTER 
COMPANY 

Bobby Edwards-Manager 

E. W., Dorece le Randy Rust-Owners 

and treat the family to a tasty 
drink, or call them today and 
learn about the profits you can 
enjoy with refreshing Dr. 
Pepper in your business. 

The authors of this 1977 
Consumer Review point out 
there is no other firm that we 
wish to compliment more upon 
rendering the public such 
wonderful service than this Dr. 
Pepper- Pepsi Cola Bottling 
Company. 

vending machines. Let them 
show you how Pepsi Cola can 
add profits to pleasure in your 
business (They also are 
distributors Crush Flavor-
Frosty Root Beer, Nu- Grape, 
Delaware Punch. 

Throughout the year Dr. 
Pepper is the favorite drink for 
those who demand something 
healthful and tasty, Drink 
bottled Dr. Pepper at 10, 2 and 
4. Take home a carton today 

Dr. Pepper and Pepsi Cola is 
distributed in this area by the 
Dr. Pepper- Pepsi Cola Bot-
tling Company at I- 20 in 
Ranger phone 647- 3238. 

Pepsi Cola has become a 
favorite in this area and 
throughout the world for its 
distinctive, consistent great 
taste. 

This firm operates trucks 
throughout the area that 
deliver this beverage to many 
retail establishments and 

W. E. GREENWOOD AUTO PARTS 
"Your Complete Auto Supply Store" 

Waymond And JoAnn Greenwood-Owners CLARK'S ELECTRIC 
Truly Clark-Owner 

The Rust Processing Center 
located halfway between Cisco 
& Eastland phone 442- 3495. 
Custom processing is their 
business- their only business! 

Rust Processing Center has 
all the latest equipment to 
butcher your meats so you can 
get the most from your beef or 
hog. They work on the prin-
ciple that every customer must 
have the best and most expert 
service they can provide. 

Regardless of what you have 
to be cut and wrapped, the 
experts here at this meat 
packing company can handle 
the job in the most professional 
manner so that you get the 
most of each particular cut of 
meat, and cut the right way so 
that is will be more tender. 
They will completely wrap it 

for you and freeze it. All of this 
will be done in the shortest 
time. 

Sanitary conditions are 
maintained at all times and 
they are inspected and ap-
proved by the proper 
authorities. Bring them your 
beef or hog and they will but-
cher it exactly the way you 
prefer it to be done. 

The editing staff of this 1977 
Consumer Review suggest to 
our readers that they are 
fortunate to have such a 
trustworthy custom cutting 
service and suggest that you 
remember to call Rust 
Processing Center. We com-
mend the management for 
their efforts to serve our people 
honestly and fairly. 

THORNTON FEED MILL 
J. W. Stevens-Manager 

Clark's Electric located at 
402 Avenue I in Cisco, phone 
442- 3586, specializes in central 
heating, air conditioning and 
refrigeration electriacl con-
tracting and are remodeling 
specialists. No job is too small 
and no job is too large for this 
well known firm. They also are 
your authorized service on all 
major appliances including 
General Electric, 

Why spend a lot of time 
looking around in smaller 
places for parts or accessories 
when you can have access to 
their large stock. Remember 
the name, the W.E. Greenwood 
Auto Parts when in need of 
anything in the new or rebuilt 
automobile or truck parts or 
accessories line. In writing this 
1977 Review, we, the editors, 
give our recommendation to 
this reliable firm. Remember 
W.E. Greenwood Auto Parts for 
all your auto and truck parts. 

air conditioners, ranges and 
dryers. 

Clark's Electric's policy has 
been fair to all without 
sacrificing quality. Know you 
are receiving the best that is 
offered and call the Clark's 
Electric for expert electrical 
contracting work. 

This 1977 Consumer Review 
and its authors completely 
endorse Clark's Electric. 

Westinghouse, Hot Point and 
Tappan. 

At Clark Electric, they know 
how to contend with your 
wiring problems. They have 
proved their ability during the 
time they have served this 
entire community. No elec-
trical contractor in this section 
has met with more success than 
this outstanding firm of con-
tractors. They also do wiring of 

We wish to compliment the 
management of this well known 
parts house for offering the 
people of this community auto 
accessories and parts at 
reasonable prices. They offer a 
full line of speed equipment, 
exhaust systems, shock ab-
sorbers, etc. They also have a 
complete line of parts, in-
cluding: engine parts, tune- up 
kits, gaskets, water and fuel 
pumps and more. If you want 
parts or accessories you can 
depend on, be sure to see this 
reliable establishment.  

The W.E. Greenwood Auto 
Parts at 107 South Commerce in 
Ranger, phone 647- 3026, has 
one of the largest stocks of new 
and rebuilt auto and truck parts 
and accessories in this section. 

W.E. Greenwood Auto Parts 
have had years of experience in 
auto machine work and can be 
depended upon to give you 
excellent workmanship. Due to 
their completely equipped 
machine shop, they can turn 
out more work for their 
customers in a shorter length of 
time and at reasonable prices. 

RANGER GENERAL HOSPITAL 
Joe Langford-Administrator 

GREGG VAN LINES 
Serving Eastland, Cisco And Ranger 

Greg sedalo - Owner 

Dedicated to providing the-
finest medical care that modern 
science is capable of, the 
Ranger General Hospital is well 
known as a major factor in the 
growth and development of the 
community. This respected 
hospital has been prominent in 
caring for the health of local 
residents for years now, and is 
widely acclaimed for its staff of 
general practitioners and spec- 

instead it is the nutritive value 
of the feed you're using. You 
can save a lot of money on your 
feed bill if you use only those 
feeds that are high in proper 
nutritive content. 

For all your livestock feed as 
well as farm supplies, fine 
fertilizers, and seed go to the 
Thornton Feed Mill or phone 
442- 1122. 

In this 1977 Consumer Review 
we, the editors, are happy to 
recommend Thornton Feed 
Mill. 

The Thornton Feed Mill is 
located at 1200 Avenue D in 
Cisco. Here they feature the 
finest in all types of feeds, 
seeds and fertilizers. 

If you are a rancher or far-
mer, no doubt you are always in 
need of feed for live- stock or 
poultry. To get the desired 
results from feeding, you must 
first be sure you are feeding the 
right thing. Here you'll find 
men who are well qualified to 
advise you on the proper feeds 
you should use. It is not the 
amount given that counts, 

For all types of local and long 
distance moving, call the Gregg 
Van Lines for dependable 
moving and storage service. 

The compilers of this 1977 
Consumer Review endorse with 
out complete recommendation 
this highly reliable moving and 
storage company: Gregg Van 
Lines. 

C & D FEED, INC. 
Jay Carter-President 

of a hat. They have an excellent 
reputation for reliability, careful 
handling, courtesy and prompt-
ness. Their years of experience 
and their impeccable reputation 
are your guarantee. 

Don't take chances by doing 
your own moving. Let these 
moving experts do the job 
quickly and efficiently. You'll 
be glad you did. 

The Gregg Van Lines locate(' 
at 301 North Seaman in 
Eastland and 401 Avenue D in 
Cisco, phone 629-2801. Gregg 
Van Lines firm features every 
type of moving, packing and 
storage service available. 

A moving company should be 
chosen with as much care as you 
use when selecting your furni-
ture. Don't just pick a name out 

recognized all Medicare bene-
fits and has liberal credit plans 
avayable. It's one hospital 
which is staffed with skill and 
run with compassion. 

In compiling this 1977 Con-
sumer Review of leading 
community members, we, the 
authors. are pleased to be able 
to list and recommend such an 
outstanding facility as Ranger 
General Hospital. 

ialists in many fields. 
Located on Hwy. 80 West 

near Ranger Junior College in 
Ranger. phone 647-1156. Ran-
ger General Hospital offers a 
full range of services from 
outpatient to surgical to mater-
nity to specialities. There's no 
better place to receive the type 
of care that only modern 
medical science can provide. 

The Ranger General Hospital 

EASTLAND MANOR AND VALLEY VIEW LODGE 
Laurette Lawler-Administrator 	 Marie Townsend-Administrator 

BOB CARROLL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 
Bob Carroll-Owner 

• 

that you've been looking for. 
This company reputation rides 
on every job they undertake 
and they strive to complete 
YOUR project to your 
satisfaction. 

The editors of this 1977 
Consumer Review suggest that 
you DON'T plan ANY new 
construction without checking 
with Bob Carroll Construction 
Company. Remember: The 
bigger the job.... the better they 
like it. 

Any information concerning 
proper feeding can be had by 
inquiring 	from 	the 
management of this firm, all in 
keeping with their policy to 
render every service possible 
to their patrons. It has been 
their aim to offer reliable 
products at honest prices. 

The C&D Feed Store, Inc., is 
located in Eastland at 301 N. 
Seaman. Phone 629- 2173. 

From this 1977 Review we, 
the 	narrators, 	happily 
recommend this company to 
our readers. 

One of the concerns upon 
which the ranchers of our 
community depend a great deal 
is the C&D Feed Store, Inc. 
This firm has been a friend to 
the farmer for many years and 
has made a host of friends 
throughout this area. 

They are rendering a service 
of beneift to the people 
throughout their trading area. 
They are dealers in feeds, 
seeds, and fertilizers which will 
keep your livestock and soil in 
the best of condition. They 
offer a complete feed service to 
fill your every need. 

Got a Big construction job? 
In the Eastland and Brown 
County area, there's one good 
outfit to call and we're talking 
about Bob Carroll Construction 
Company: 	the "big" job 
contractors! 

Located at 912 Patterson in 
Eastland, phone 629- 1387 with 
their shop located in Ranger, 
phone 647- 9374, this is one 
construction company with the 
skill, equipment and men to get 
the job done right. Years of 
experience and many out- 

equipped and decorated with 
the patient's comfort and good 
attitude in mind. 

All meals provided are under 
the watchful supervision of 
persons well schooled in 
preparing the special foods 
required for each patient. 

The editing staff of this 1977 
Consumer Review suggest this 
convalescent hospital to our 
readers, we know that you will 
be extremely pleased with the 
care procedures and modern 
facilities at Eastland Manor 
and Valley View Lodge. 

standing completions serve as 
their finest recommendations. 
They will be proud to show you 
their referral list of satisfied 
customers. 

They feature general con-
struction work, site work, crush 
rock, dirt work, heavy 
equipment, hauling, permitted 
salt water rollers, custom 
plowing and paving anywhere, 
anytime. 

Just give them a call and 
their trained estimator will be 
happy to submit that LOW bid 

including their Registered 
Nurses who supervise 24 hours 
a day were hand picked for their 
job at this respected 
convalescent hospital. The 
management here realizes that 
their patients must be 
professionally attended to both 
day and night, and that good 
mental therapy is sometimes 
just as important as the drugs 
and remedies prescribed by 
their doctor. 

Each of the rooms here are 
well lighted and air con-
ditioned, and have been 

Their patient's comfort and 
health is the most important 
effort of the fine staff of the 
Eastland Manor and Valley 
View Lodge at 1405 W. Com-
merce and 700 S. Ostrom in 
Eastland, phone 629- 2686 and 
629- 1779. 

They feature a full time 
social director, private and 
semi- private rooms, luxurious 
dining and recreation facilities, 
game tables, a beauty and 
barber shop plus a chapel, 
cable TV and lounge make 
them most modern. 
Each of their employees, 

REYNOLDS MANUFACTURING 
CO. 

J. L. Stafford is George Owens-Owners 

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE COMPANY 
The Area's Finest 

Buddy Aaron - Manager 

R.M. SNEED CONTRACTOR, INC. 
Mary E. Sneed-President 

Don Doyle - Office Manager 
Susie Maynard a Shelia Wright - Vice Presidents 

Howard Maynard & Ceti Copeland - Spread Foreman 

Farm Bureau Insurance is 
located in the Farm Bureau 
Bldg in Eastland phone 
629-1704. There is no 
institution that is conducted in 
the area, which is deserving of 
more favorable comment than 
this well known firm. Members 
of Farm Bureau and subscribers 
to Farm Bureau Insurance have 
long looked to these concerns as 
serving the best interests of the 
agricultural community with 
service and integrity Farm 
Bureau was organized in the 
',best interests of the agricultural 
community and dedicated to 

WE'LL TELL YOU WHERE 
YOU CAN GET IT! 

The Reynold's Manufactur-
ing Company's many fine • 
products are among the very 
best on the market. Their 
success is as much as result of 
their business policies as it is a 
result of their products, though, 
and their customers are always 
the first to put in a good word 
regarding any and all business 
dealings with them. 

In composing this listing of 
leading firms in the area, we, 
the writers of this 1977 
Consumer Review are pleased 
to be able to list this 
outstanding manufacturer, Re-
ynolds Manufacturing Company 
and recommend them to our 
readers. 

A leading manufacturer of 
aluminum replacement and 
windows & aluminum storm 
windows in bronze, silver and 
white, the Reynold's Manufac-
turing Co.'s offices in Cisco 
have to be considered a 
valuable asset to the financial 
well-being of the community. 
Located at 105 E. 6th, phone 
442-1380, Reynolds Manufac-
turing Company features the 
type of business ethics and 
community spirit that people 
look for when they think of a 
quality-minded firm. Residents 
of the area should be proud to 
have such a fine company 
located in the community. 
CONTACT US FOR ALL OF 
YOUR WINDOW, DOOR & 
STORE DOOR WINDOW NE-
EDS. IF WE DON'T HAVE IT, 

day weeks," since the oil 
industry never sleeps. While 
others are observing legal 
holidays people like R.M. Sneed 
Contractor, Inc. are on the job, 
searching for, drilling for, 
producing and refining the oil 
on which our nation depends. 
We, the editors of this 1977 

Consumer Review wish to 
commend the R.M. Sneed 
Contractor Inc. and its owners 
for their outstanding service to 
this area and to the nation. 

The Oil business can be a 
risky one---a business in which 
fortunes are made and lost 
every day. But for every 
individual who has made a 
fortune or lost one in a big oil 
gamble, there are thousands of 
smaller businessman suppliers, 
drillers, seismic operators, 
geologists, engineers pipeline 
& oil field contractors such as 
R.M. Sneed Contractor, Inc. 
located at Hwy. 80 East in 
Eastland phone 629-1756. 
Like other of this business 

of the people in the most 
straightforward 	and 
business-like manner and offer 
many protection plans to fit all 
needs, including the farm and 
liablity as well as auto, life, 
disability and crop hail 
protection. Farm Bureau 
Insurance is qualified under the 
Keogh plan and has a 
retirement policy available. 

In writing this 1977 Review, 
we. the authors, are pleased to 
suggest that you contact the 
Farm Bureau Insurance for all 
insurance 	needs. 

Pat Pullman - Secretary 
R.M. Sneed Contractor, Inc. 
spends his days helping find 
and develop new sources of 
energy to meet todays 
evergrowing demands for 
top-quality 	petroleum 
---products to run our cars, heat 
our homes, package and 
preserve our foods, an even for 
use in drugs found in 
everyone's home. 
People in the oilfield 

contracting profession such as 
R.M. Sneed Contractor don't 
work 8 hour days--they work 8 

free market practices. Now, 
Farm Bureau Insurance is 
available to urban as well as 
rural subscribers. 
Each year the value of 

insurance is more than ever 
recognized as shown by they 
ever increasing number of 
policies that arc written. When 
in need of anything in the 
insurance service, you can do no 
better than to take your 
problems to this reliable firm 
who are the local agents for 
Farm Bureau, one of the older 
and more respected firms in 
America. They meet the needs 

RANGER LIVESTOCK AUCTION COMPANY 
Owners 

Fred Rogers , Vernon Surratt, Tommy Bacon, Ellison Carter 

SOUTHERN TELEVISION 

SYSTEMS CORP. 

SUPER BURGER 

Food For The 

Whole Foray 

Asa Walters-Owner 
Selling your livestock is a 

difficult task. Why not do what 
smart ranchers in this area do 
and let the Ranger Livestock 
Auction Company on Hwy. 80 
E. in Ranger, phone 647-3247. 
sell your livestock for you? 
You're always assured of the 
best possible prices and fair 
treatment when you consign 
with this respected salesyard. 
Ranger Livestock Auction 

RANGER JUNIOR COLLEGE 
Summer Term Begins June 1st 

And 

Enrollment For Fall Term Accepted Al Summer 
very finest shape and they use 
the 	latest 	promotional 
techniques to draw the buyers. 
Check into the possibilities of 

letting the Ranger Livestock 
Auction Company handle All of 
your sales! As the authors of 
this 1977 Consumer Review, we 
think you'll like the service you 
get at Ranger Livestock Auction 
Company. 

Dr. Jack Elsom 

Company draws buyers from 
throughout the section and the 
prices generally run at the top 
of the market. As the "middle 
man" in the cattle trar.saction. 
this reputable firm knows what 
it takes to get the most from 
YOUR stock. If they can't get a 
good price for your animals it's 
bad for their business. They 
endeavor to keep your 
consignment of livestock in the 

- President 

BIG COUNTRY VENDING 
"Try The Rest Then Get The Best" 

442-1913, and in Ranger at 112 
Rusk, phone 647-3250. 
Call today and ask them about 

the wide range of programs 
with their service. Not only will 
you g.et a greater choice of 
normal progratathig but you 
get instant weather, news and 
spots, as well as continuous 
uniterrupted FM music, all with 
just a twist of the wrist. 
The compilers of this 1977 

Consumers Review suggest that 
you contact this reliable firm. 
You will be pleasantly surprised 
at the modest rates they charge 
for this comprehensive service. 

Are you really getting the most 
aut-of your television? Before 
you answer that „question 
answer this one. How inany 
channels do you receive? If you 
don't get at least all the local 
area VHF Channels you can't be 
realizing the best return on the 
money you spent on your TV. 
You say you didn't know you 

could get all the local area VHF 
channels in this area. Well you 
can if you get in touch with the 
Southern Television Systems 
Corporation at 201 N. Seaman 
in Eastland. phone 629-1580 
and 309 W. 8th in Cisco, phone 

HAILEY JACK I. 
Headquarters in this area for 

all types of coin-operated 
vending machines is Big 
Vending, P.O. Box 322 in 
Eastland, phone 629-8849. 'This 
locally owned and operated firm 
is proud to be a part of the 
growing community and they're 
doing their part by supplying 
merchants in all trades with the 
fines in vending machines and 
service. 
Big Country Vending has a 

complete assortment of the 
latest electronic games and a 

Drive on in for good eating ! 
That's the motto at the Super 
Burger where your food is 
prepared using only the finest 
ingredients and the most 
careful procedures. 

Located at 1001 West 8th in 
Cisco, phone 442- 1972, Super 
Burger features all of your 
traditional favorites as well as 
some very special delicacies. 
Hamburgers, hot dogs, steak 
sandwiches and many other 
delicious and nourishing 
sandwiches are popular items 
on their fabulous menu. Be 
sure to order a cold, refreshing 
soft drink or a thick, creamy 
shake to go with your sandwich 
and don't forget crispy french 
fries! 

If you're in a hurry and can't 
wait too long, just phone in your 
order and it will be ready when 
you are. 	Call 442- 1972 for 
orders to go. 

The writers of this 1977 
Consumer Review would like to 
take this opportunity to com-
mend the Super Burger for 
their fine food and fantastic 
service. 

complete line of pool tables, 
pin-ball, foosball, juke boxes 
and other machines. You'll 
appreciate the profits the 
machines make, the highest 
commissions and everyone will 
appreciate the convenience of 
having these games so close. 
The writers of this 1977 
Consumer Review urge you to 
contact Big Country Vending 
today and find out more about 
the many possibilites of vending 
machines! 

The Ranger Junior College is 
located in Ranger on College 
Circle. phone 647-3234. There 
is a fine spirit of cooperation 
between faculty and student 
body here. This is the place to 
secure a thorough education 
amid ideal surroundings. 
In keeping with their 

continuing growth, Ranger 
Junior College offers the latest 
in 	Technical 	Vocational 
programs including a "Licensed 
Vocational Nursing program" 
and a program of office 
occupations as well as welding. 
automotive mechanicals 
mechanics, air conditioning, 
real 	estate, 	and 	law 
enforcement. These programs 
will aid young people in this 
area in preparing for a better 
future. 
In addition to courses in 

Ranger, Ranger Junior College 
offers extension courses in 

equipment are ready to go 
throughout the year. so you 
never need to wait when there's 
oil to find. Phone 442-2008 or 
drop by their offices at 1412 
Park Dr. in Cisco to discuss 
YOUR needs with the 
professionals! 

The writers of this 1977 
Consumer Review are pleased 
to be able to recommend him 
and we feel that YOUR oil 
projects will go a lot smoother 
with Jack I. Hailey on the job! 

When you need qualified work 
on a new well site, an existing 
well that needs completing or 
an old one which requires a 
workover...call in the pros! 
Jack I. Hailey specializes in all 
types of oil well service 
including new wells, workovers 
and completions. Call them 
first, whenever you want the 
absolute best service that's 
available. 
Dependable well service is 

always available from this Jack 
I. Hailey. His crews and 

DeLeon, Comanche, Graham, 
and Olney. 
Ranger Junior College is in the 

hands of a most able and 
efficient faculty who are 
progressive and realize the 
present day tendencies and 
requirements. 
As one of the foremost 

institutions of its kind in this 
country, Ranger Junior College 
has contributed in a large 
degree to the reknown and the 
stength of this section. 
People of this community are 

offered the advantages and 
benefits of one of the most 
progressive, up-to-date and 
qualified colleges of the 
country. 
In this 1977 Review, we, the 

editors, wish to congratulate the 
Ranger Junior College upon the 
valuable service they are 
offering to the people of this 
area. 



We can't advise you how to dress when you ride a horse, but 
we are experts on advising you on money matters. 
Savings-plans to fit your needs are a speciality with us so 
come in and talk to us now. 

Member  FADAIACA 

EXCELLENCE IN BANKING • DRIVE-IN BANKING PARKING 

(14 The BACK FORTY 

"He said he wanted to be a bareback bronc 

rider." 

RISING STAR. TEXAS 70471 

Thursday, Mardi 24, 1971 
90111.111.. 41111allo 

Commentary 
By Myrtle Owen 

Pioneer News 
Mrs. A.C. Mika 
	 . amilftaJ 

homosexuality. Wannetta 
announces that she has been 
invited to Coleman to speak 
against ERA in the near near 
future. The date will be an-
nounced over the Cross Plains 
Radio News and in the 
Newspaper soon. 

This is agriculture Week. 
Maybe there will be something 
constructive come out of the 
"rhetoric" we will be hearing 
this week. The complexity of 
life caused by a planned 
economy, poses doubts in the 
mind of thinking people as to 
what CA N be done to improve 
the status quo of the American 
farmer. It was in the decade of 
the Fifties, one could easily 
observe the exodus of the small 
farmer to the tow ns and cities. 
Then in the Sixties we began to 
observe how the swelling of 
Metropolitan population ad-
de4d to monumental social and 
economic problems of the 
whole country. 

These 	are 	negative 
viewpoints of the solution of an 
enourmous problem; one that 
breaks down into many many 
lesser problems, yet to be 
solved. A more -positive 
viewpoint may be teaken, now 
that we observe an exodus back 
to the rural areas by many 
brave souls who, no doubt, have 
visi ons of a more ideal en-
vironment for "growing kids" 
and making a life for them-
selves. Let us hope that in-
flation, energy controls etc. do 
not reverse this latest trend 
toward a rural society made up 
of the large ARMY of young 
men and women who "Can't 
find jobs." And now some 
quotes by writers more 
talented to say jobs." And now 
some quotes by writers more 
talented to say it like it ought to 
be said: 

"To own a bit of ground, to 
scratch it with a hoe, to plant 
seeds, and to watch the renewal 
of life this is the commonest 
delight of the race, the most 
satisfactory thing a man can 
do." Warner 

God Almighty first planned a 
garden; and indeed it is the 
purest of human pleasures." 
Francis Bacon. 

And finally remember that 
Emerson said, "Even great 
man is unique." 

- - - 
Many relatives and friends 

visited Mr. and Mrs. Calvin 
Roady this week. They were 
Mrs. Ethel Brown, Mike Mc-
Carty, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Sessumsall of Pioneer. Mr. and 
Mrs. H.A. Freeman and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bob Roady of Cross 
Plains. Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
McNeil of Baird, Mr. and Mrs. 
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For All Your 
Business Needs 

Come By 
The Rising Star Office 

ENVELOPES 
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TIRE SAFETY FILLERS 
The Tire Industry Safety 

Council says the severe winter 
of 1976-77 is expected to 
produce a record number of 
potholes on America's streets 
and highways. This in turn will 
create an additional hazard to 
tires. The Council says properly 
inflated tires and reduced 
speeds on bad roads are the 
best way to deal with potholes. 

N.A. Roady Anson; Mr. Frank 
Crow, Baird, Mrs. Baxter of 
Cross Plains and Mr. and Mrs. 
Cliff Holden of Kentucky. 

Mrs. Thomas Flippin brought 
her father, Mr. Willard Melton, 
from the Eastland Hospital to 
the Cross Plains Rest Home 
last Thursday. She reports that 
he is doing well and he can walk 
without a cane. He is 
recovering from hip surgery. 
She also reports that their 
grandson, Johnnie Flippin is 
doing very well in a Dallas 
Hospital after open- heart 
surgery last Tuesday. He can 
walk around and he is taking 
solid foods. Mrs. Flippin and 
family wish to extend their 
thanks to the blood doners in 
the Rising Star Cross Plains 
areas. Katy Wolf, a former 
resident of Pioneer and now 
residing in Haskell, is in 
Hendricks Hosptal, Abilene, 
where she is being treated for a 
broken arm. 

Robin "Red Breast" and 
potholes are sure signs of 
spring, says the Tire Industry 
Safety Council. If you want to 
avoid cuts, bruises, and 
blowouts that may occur when 
striking potholes. slow down on 
bad roads and give your tires a 
chance. 

Drs. Lou and Charles 
Rodenberger spent Thursday, 
Friday and Saturday with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. A.C. 
Halsell, during Spring Break 
from A&M Uni. Dianna Taylor 
had lunch with her grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. A.C. 
Halsell, Friday, enroute home 
to Denton from San Angelo 
State College, where she will 
visit her parents during Spring 
Break. Rev. and Mrs. John 
Swift and Rhonda visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Halsell on Thursday. 
Dr. Charles Rodenberger will 
speak to a Junior Engineering 
group in Breckenridge, on 
Wednesday at 9:00 a.m. 

FILE FOLDERS 

LEDGERS 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Flem-
ming and family of Denver City 
visited his parents during the 
weekend. Other visitors were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Sessums and 
Mrs. Betty Merion of Pioneer. 

TYPEWRITER RIBBONS 
I ADDING MACHINE TAPE 
I 	COMMERCIAL PRINTING 
I RUBBER STAMPS MADE TO ORDER 
ilh. 6434141 Located On West Main Street 

Visitors with Mrs. Ethel 
Brown were Mrs. Elwood 
Baxter of Cross Plains, Velma 
Brown, Pioneer and Mrs. Dean 
of Rising Star. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. C.T. Barton of 

Pioneer and Mr. Billie Zirkle of 
Rising Star visited, during the 
week, with Mr. and Mrs. J.T. 
Beggs. 

On Friday evening Mrs. 
Henry Ring hosted a surprise 
Birthday Party at the 
Lakewood Recreation Center 
for Mr. Henry Ring, Homer 
Don Parsons and Mrs. Edna B. 
Gattis. A large group of family 
and friends attended. There 
were many 	heaut ifully 
decorated tables, including the 
Buffet tabi Games of 42 and 
Yahtzee were played. This was 
a gala event; not only for the 
honorees but for all the guests. 

Those having Sunday lunch 
with Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Parsons were Mr. and Mrs. 
Cowan Hutton, Lynn Hutton, 
and friend, Champ. Champion. 

Wannetta Parsons wishes to 
state that interested citizens 
may write to Singer Sewing 
Machine Co. P.O. Box 2545 N.Y. 

N.Y. 10001, if they wish to 
express disapproval of the 
canceling of Anita' Bryant's 
film contract because of her 
stand against legalizing 

The winter of 1976-77, with its 
record breaking cold, was 
probably the toughest in recent 
history on roads, says the 
Federal 	Highw ay 
Administration. Damage is 
expected to be very severe, 
creating hazards to both tires 
and cars. The Tire Industry 
Safety Council says slow down 
on pothole-marred roads and 
make sure your tires are 
properly 	inflated. 

"Community on Revelation" 
Rev. 1: And I turned to see the 

voice that spake with me. 
Verses 12 through 16 and 17: 
And being turned, I saw seven 
golden candlesticks; (v-13) and 
in the midst of the seven 
candlesticks one like unto the 
Son of man, clothed with a 
garment down to the foot, and 
girt about the paps with a 
golden girdle. 
(v. 17) His head and his hairs 

were white like wool, as white 
as snow; and his eyes were as a 
flame of fire; (v. 15) and his feet 
like unto fine brass, as if they 
burned in a furnace; and his 
voice as the sound of many 
waters (. 16) and he had in his 
right hand seven stars: and out 
of his mouth went a sharp two 
edged sword: and his 
countenance was as the sun 
shineth in his strength. 
Coto: The seven candlesticks 

are the seven churches. Christ 
in the midst of the church. in 
John 8:12) Jesus said, "I am the 
light of the world: he that 
followeth me shall not walk in 
darkness, But shall have the 
light of life." Christ dwells 
among the churches to make his 
followers also lights in a 
sin-darken ed world. 

Myrtle Owen 

Easter 
Sunrise 
Services a 0 small 

Easter Sunrise Service is set 
for April 10 at 6:30 a.m. at the 
First Baptist Church. 
Further information about the 

service will be presented by 
Pastor Hubert Taylor of the 
First United Methodist Church. 

It's a Fun Family Thing--
Read the Want Ads. 

-* silf. Alt 
let 
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City Of Rising Star To 
Receive 1,396.79 City 
Sales Tax Rebates 

Hounsel And Long Take Honors 
In Eastland County Show 

owners and other small retail 
businesses. 
Effective immediately, those 

small retailers who collect $300 
or less a year in state sales taxes 
will be allowed to file their 
returns and remit the tax money 
to the state once a year instead 
of every three months. 
Only those sales tax permit 

holders who collected $100 or 
less a year in state sales taxes 
have been eligible in the past to 
take advantage to the yearly 
filings, the Comptroller said. 
The rule change will also ease 

the workload for his office, 
cutting state costs for handling 
the returns. Bullock said. 
The city of Rising Star is to 

receive 83,396.79 for the period 
ending 	 2 - 2 5 - 7 7 . 

Reserve Champion 
Predominantyly Black Market 
Swine- Bobby Adams, Ranger 
FFA. 

Lightweight Predominantly 
White Market Swine- 1. Dave 
Gressett, Gorman 4- H; 2. 
Ranger FFA Chapter hog; 3. 
Randy Laminack, Gorman 
FFA. 

Heavyweight Predominantly 
White Market Swine- 1. Jamie 
Snider, Gorman FFA; 2. Marty 
Carr, Gorman FFA; 3. Kim 
Rogers, Carbon 4- H. 

Champion Predominantly 
White Market Swine- Jamie 
Snider, Gorman FFA. 

Reserve Champion 
Predominantly White Market 
Swine- Dave Gressett, Gorman 
4- h. 
Grand Champion Market 
Swine- Russ Gressett, Gorman 
4- H, Hamsphire Duroc corss. 

Reserve Grand Champion 
Market Seine- John Hill, 
Eastland FFA, Duroc. 

City sales and use tax 
allocation summary thru period 
ending 02-25-77;(1) Gross 
Collections, 53,42038,(2) State 
2 percent fee-$68.41,(3) Prior 
Period Bal.-$214.59,(4) AMT 
Retained-$169.77, (5) Payment 
To City-53.396.79-(5-- I -2 plus 3 
-4) 

Bergland To 
Testify In On 

Farm Bill 

Treasurer 
City of Rising Star 

Box 35 
Rising Star. Tx. 

76471 

Austin--Comptroller Bob 
Bullock announced Tuesday 
that city sales tax rebates for 
the first quarter of 1977 totaled 
a record $89.5 million, up, 18.5 
percent from the same 
month period last year. 
Bullock said that the record 

rebates--which exceeded the 
previous quarterly high by more 
than $5 million (second quarter, 
1976) were based on record 
sales during the 1976 Christmas 
season. 
(Most retailers file their sales 

tax reports on a quarterly basis. 
These reports for the Christmas 
quarter were due January 31 for 
procession and are now 
reflected in the March 
allocations.) 
"We knew that Christmas 

sales were gding to be up, but, 
frankly, this was more than we 
dared hope for," said Bullock. 
"This is a late but welcome 
Christmas gift for city 
treasuries across the state." 
Bullock said his office has sent 

867 Texas cities checks totaling 
$59 million as their March share 
of city sales tax collections. This 
is an 11,7 percent increase over 
the same month last year. 
Bullock also announced that 

his office has adopted a new 
rule change which will reduce 
the paperwork for same 20,000 
"mom and pop" grocery store 

Thursday, March 24 
Enchiladas with chili and 

cheese 
Pinto Beans 
Lettuce and tomatoes 
Crackers and cornbread 
Catsup 
Mixed fruit 
Milk 

Friday. March 25 
Hamburgers 
Lettuce and tomatoes 
Onions and pickles 
French fries 
Catsup 
Peach cobbler 
Milk 

Monday, March 28 
Fish with tartar sauuce and 

catsup 
Buttered corn 
Blackeyed peas 
Hot rolls 
Peach halves 
Milk 

Tuesday, March 29 
Fried Turkey 
Cheese and macaroni 
English peas 
Hot rolls 
Peanut butter and syrup, 
Applesauce 
Milk 

Wednesday, March 30 
Chicken and noodles 
Creamed potatoes 
Green beans 
Hot rolls 
J ello 
Milk 

EASTLAND COUNTY 
LIVESTOCK SHOW RESULTS 
FROM FRIDAY DAIRY 
CATTLE DIVISION 

Heifer calves, 6 mos.- 11 
mos.- - 1. David Good, Gorman 
FFA; 2. Kenneth Good, Gor-
man FFA; 3. Joan White, Cisco 
4- H. 

Heifer calves, 1 year and 
prior- 1. David Good, Gorman 
FFA. 

Cows, 3 years and over- 1. 
David Good, Gorman FFA; 2. 
Kenneth Good, Gorman FFA; 
3. Kenneth Good, Gorman FFA. 

Grand Champion Dairy 
Female- David Good, Gorman 
FFA. 

Reserve Grand Champion 
Dairy Female- Kenneth Good, 
Gorman FFA. 

Bulls, 1 year through 23 
mos.- 1. Kenneth Good, Gor-
man FFA. 

Grand Champion Bull- 
Kenneth Good, Gorman FFA. 

SWINE DIVISION 
Breeding Swine 

Class 1 Predominatly Red- 1. 
Ken Hounsel, Rising Star FFA; 
2. Willacnd Collins, Eastland 
FFA; 3. Sid Woods, Eastland 
FFA. 

Class II Predominantly Red- 
1. John Hill, Eastland FFA; 2. 
Dwayne Hunter, Eastland 
FFA; 3. Jackie Gentry, Ranger 
FFA. 

Champion Red Gilt- Ken 
Hounsel, Rising Star FFA. 

Reserve Champion Red Gilt-
John Hill, Eastland FFA. 

Class VI Predominantly 
White- 1. Forrest Starr, Cisco 
FFA; 2. Revise Laminack, 
Gorman FFA: 3. Noble 
Laminack. Gorman 4- Fl. 

Class VII Predominantly 
White- 1. John Hill, Eaxtland 
FFA; 2. Carbon FFA Chapter 
hog. 

Champio n White Gilt- John 
Hill, Eastland FFA. 

Reserve Champion White 
Gilt- Forrest SStarr 	Cisco 
FFA. 

Class XI Predominantly 
Black- 1. David Dill, Cisco 
FFA; 2. Noble Laminack, 
Gorman 4- H: 3. Jeff Bowling. 
Gorman FFA. 

Class XII Predominantly 
Black- 1. Jamie Snider, Gor-
man FFA. 

Champion Black Gilt- David 
Dill. Cisco FFA 

Champion Medium Wool 
-Deana Thompson. Cisco FFA. 
Reserve Champion Medium 

Wool Ewe- Scott Anderson, 
Cisco 4-H. 
Medium wool ram, two tooth 

and under-1. Deana Thompson, 
Cisco FFA. 
Medium wool ram four tooth 

and older-1. Penny Berry, Cisco 
4-H 2. Joan White, Cisco 4-H. 
Champion medium wool 

-Penny Berry, Cisco 4-H. 
Reserve Champion medium 

wool ram-Joan White, Cisco 
4-H. 
Champion Southdown 

Scott Anderson, Cisco 4-H. 
MARKET LAMB DIVISION 

Fine wool lambs-1. Tammy 
Spurlen, Eastland 4-H; 2. 
Glenita Seaton. Gorman FFA; 
3. Evan Brun, Cisco FFA. 
Champion 	Fine 	wool 

-Tamy Spurlen, Eastland 4-H. 
Reserve Champion Fine Wool 

Lamb-Glenita Seaton, Gorman 
FFa. 
Fine Wool cross lambs-1. 

Carter Boyd, Cisco 4-H; 2. 
Randy Green Gorman FFA; 3. 
Glenita Seaton. Gorman FFA. 
Champion Fine Wool Cross 

Lamb-Carter Boyd, Cisco 4-H. 
Reserved Champion Fine Wool 

Cross Lamb-Randy green, 
Gorman FFA. 

Medium wool lambs-1. Terry 
Lasater. Cargon FFA; 2. Kim 
Rodgers. Carbon 4-H 3. Mike 
Bledsoe, Carbon FFa. 
Champion Medium Wool 

Lamb-Kim Rodgers. Carbon 
4-H. 
Southdown lambs-1. Jami 

Long. Rising Star 41H; 2. Dale 
Spurlen, Eastland FFA; 3. _Jami 
Long. 
Champion Southdown 

-Jami Long. Rising Star 4-H. 
Reserve Champion Southdown 

Lamb-Dale Spurlen, Eastland 
FFA. 

Reserve Champion Black 
Gilt- Jamie Snider, Gorman 
FFA. 

Grand Champion Gilt- Ken 
Hounsel, Rising Star FFA, 
Duroc. 

Reserve Grand Champion 
Gilt- John Hill, Eastland FFA, 
Duroc. 

Market Sine 
Lightweight ?redominantly 

Red Market Swine- 1. John 
Hill, Eastland FFA; 2. James 
Doyle, Eastland FFA; 3. John 
Hill, Eastland FFA. 

Heaveyweight 
Predominantly Red Market 
Swine- 1. 	Russ Gressett, 
Gorman 4- H; 2. Ken Hounsel, 
Rising Star FFA; 3. Biran 
Lund, Eastland FFA. 

Champion Predominantly 
Red Market Swine- John Hill, 
Eastland FFA, lightweight. 

Lightweight Predominantly 
Black Market Seine- 1. Noble 
Laminack, Gorman 4- H; 2. 
Larry Keith, Gorman FFA; 3. 
Roy Pate, Eastland FFA. 

Heaveyweight 
Predominantly Black- 1. 
Timothy Swanner, Gorman 
FFA; 2. Bobby Adams, Ranger 
FFA; 3. Steve Keith, Gorman 
FFA. 

Champion Predominantly 
Black Market Swine-
. Timothy Swanner, Gorman 
FFA. 

goat show 
Goats- I Danny Cozart. Cisco 

FFA. 
Grand Champion Goat- Danny 

Cozart, Cisco FFA. 
sheep show 

Breeding Sheep Division 
Fine wool, two tooth and under 

under ewes-1 Penny Berry, 
Cisco 4-H, 2. Penny Berry; 3. 
Tommy Donham, Nimrod 4-H. 
Fine wool, four tooth and 

over-1 Jerry Bowden, Cisco 
FFA; 2. Penny Berry. 
Champion Fine Wool 

Penny Berry, Cisco 4-H. 
Reserve Champion Fine Wool 

Ewe-Jerry Bowden, Cisco FFA. 
Medium wool, two tooth and 

under -1. Deana Thompson, 
Cisco FFA; 2. Scott Anderson, 
Cisco 4-H 3. Deana Thompson, 
Cisco FFA. 
Medium wool, four tooth and 

over-1. Joan White, Cisco 4-H. 
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AS FAR AS IS KNOWN.. . 
LAST STUD FROM SCOTTER S 

'If Better Cow Blood Known, 
SI 

Handler-Eddy Shanafelt 
Ranger, Texas 	647-1925 

Owner- Sam Beggs 	Eastland, Texas 
Phone-Day 629-2372 Night 629.1514 

Reg. Mares $100" 	Grad. Mares 40" 

OTHER HORSES FOR SALE OR TRADE . 

Farm policy shifts to center 
stage in Washington D.C. as 
Congressional hearings 
approach closing sessions in 
mid-March when Agriculture 
Secretary Bob Bergland will 
present testimony on several 
farm program bills that are, set 
to expire or be changed this 
year. 

David W. Martin, ASCS 
Executive Director, said 
Secretary Bergland is expected 
to present the Administration's 
views on March 15 to the Senate 
Committee on Agriculture:. 
Nutrition and Forestry on farm 
bills under consideration. 
On March 17 Secretary 

Bergland will participate in a 
hearing of the House 
Committee on Agriculture on 
basic legislation. Martin said. 

Leg -dation that will expire, be 
extenclidior be replace3d in 1977 
has becn under review in recent 
weeks by both Congressional 
groups and top staff of the • 
agriculture department. The 
laws include the Agricultural 
and Consumer Protection Act of 
1973. applicable to feed grains. 
wheat, cotton, wool and dairy 
products; the Rice Production 
Act of 1975; and authorization 
for Public Law 480. also known 
as the Agricultural Trade and 
Development Assistance Act of 
1954. 
Being reconsidered also is 

funding authorization for 
expiring programs under the 
Food Stamp Act of 1964. 

Secretary Bergland said that 
other farm programs that will 
be considered for updating. and 
in some cases extended and 
newly directed (but, not 
expiring), include: rural 
development. agricultural 
research, the peanut program. 
conservation programs, and the 
Federal Insecticide, Fungicide 
and Rodenticide Act. 

David W. Martin 
County Executive Director 
Eastland County Director 

Phone: 817 629 1636 



Nlanners 	hardened form of morality. 

820 W. Main 
Eastland, Texas 

• 629-1769 ....I NG FOR A 	" " **** " e this 3 bedroom home 

in Cisco w ith cent SO~Dsurrounded by pecan 

trees. ( 'all for det. 
ROOM 141 fit TWO or that or four in this neat two 

itch-ofHU himie in Eastland. Carpeted throughout with 
large living- dining room. and a Utility room. 

PRICE REDUCED to $10,510 on this 2 or 3 bedroom 
older home in Eastland. Corner lot. Downstairs has been 
remixlelea A good buy at this price. 

WINNERS CIRCLE. Place your bet on this 4 bedroom. 
3 bath, brick veneer, with central heat- air. Some 

carpet. Established yard. Terrific buy on loan assump-
tion in Cisco 

51.:1.1 \(: Is BELIEVING and you should see thi- 
IK Broom home in Cisco for $9004). Some fenced yard. 
Corner lot. 

1114:1' ! I11•:1 NOT EVERDAY you'll find a 3 bedroom. 
2 bath remodeled home in Eastland with central heat-
air, care- tree siding. huge trees, on an oversized lot. 
VILA appraisal is $22.7on. 8 percent loan. $700 down. $192 
monthly P.I. 

DELIGHTED Tt 	 s sparkling fresh 2 
bedroom. 1.vilb an oi SOLD leling job. Paneled. 
Carpeted Ihrougho 	 Monthly payments 
under $150. In Eastland. 

TWICE TIMES TWO is a duplex in Eastland. Priced al 
$12.500. This would make a good home or rental property. 
Two bedrooms on each side. Central location. Call for 
details. 

TWICE TIMES THREE is another duplex in Eastland. 
3 bedrooms. 2 baths each side with fenced yard. single car 
garages. all kitchen appliances. Ten :fk neighborhood. 

TWICE TIMES '11WEI.V14: is a - mini- Wa retiouse. Talk 
to one of our salespeople about this investment. 
Minimum upkeep. Over 12 percent return can be ex-
pected. In Eastland, 

LAKE TIME is coming again and this year- round 
home on a deeded acre can Iv yours for $18,500. Large. 3 
bedroom home has central heat- air. Staff water. 

NEED A PLACE 	 BUSY? This two 
bedroom home in I 	 ;mile rpair but is 
priced to sell at $6f 

GIVE ME ROOM, lots of room for inside play. This 3 
bedroom. 1:1.1 bath, brick veneer with central heat- air 
has been polished until it gleams. Fenced yard. Very 
reasonable down payment on new loan. In Eastland. 

W111- DR E.111? OWN IT. 2 bedroom home in Ranger. 
Large living room. Good neighborhmid. Awaiting ap-
praisal but ready for showing. 

WHISPER IN HIS EAR...You want a larger home. 
Enjoy this 3 bedrm. remodeled. home on 40 acres west of 
Cisco on I- 20. Owner has listed for $39,900. Barn,tanks. 
30 A. coastal. Call today for more information 

LITTLE: BIT DOWN. LITTLE bit a month for this home 
on LITTLE Street in Ranger. 2 or 3 bedroom on 3 lots. 
Corner location. Owners will help finance. 

LOOKING FOR AN :1.CRE? Here are 14 of them in 
Ranger. Sewer and water available. Owner will split 
acreage and will help on financing. Call us today for 
more information. 

LOTS AVAILABLE in Ranger. Eastland. and Cisco. 
COMMERCIAL BUILDING SITE.Hwy. 80 in Ranger. 

..ON THE FARM... 
Ill ACRES SOUTH OF' CISCO. Good pastures land. 

Part of minerals included. Owner finaace. 
too ACRES SOUTH OF CISCO. Highway frontage. 

Tank, trees. Financing. 
140 ACRES. CISCO AREA. Pasture land. Highway 

frontage. Terms. Good price. 
30 ACRES SOUTH OF' CISCO. Rough land, private. 

Owner. financing. 
80 ACRES. ONE MILE OUT OF GORMAN. Highway 

frontage. Sandy. 30 acres peanuts. Easy terms. Will 
split for Texas G.I. 

228 ACRES SOUTH OF EASTLAND. Good fencing. 
Peanut allotment. 100 acres new land. Excellent cattle 
working pens. Coastal. Financing. 

135 ACRES to miles SW of. Cisco. Hwy. frontage. 
5250.00 per acre. 

26 ACRES ON HVSOLDI Cisco and Eastland. 
400 frontage. 3 tank: 

 
$350- acre. 

Ray Moody, G.R.I..1- 725- 7279 
Carol Senkel 629- 1269 	Wayne Durham 629- 8212 
Larry Armstrong 629- 1342. Bill Griffith 647. 1635 
Dick Ward 442- 3524 	Gary Gilman 629- 2875 

Beth Ward, Broker. 

629-1769 
Citizens Realty ...mt.  

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY 

WSJ 
A Member of The Central and South West System 

Remember REDDY Supplies the energy— 

but only YOU can use it wisely! 

Mows the time 
to call your 

air conditioning 
serviceman. 

(Get a checkup before the heat's on.) 

Right now your air conditioning serviceman 

can easily work your call into his schedule and 

get your unit ready to deliver dependable 

cooling through the summer ahead. 

We know that many people wait until the heat's 

on to install electric air conditioning or have their 

units serviced. Later on. your dealer or serviceman 

may have a waiting list. 

WTU wants you to get the greatest value 

from your electric service. One way we can help 

is to remind you to get the lump on summer 

by calling your serviceman early. 
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May News 

• 

Maurice Burnett Jerry and 
Nany Burnett and family. Mr. 
and Mrs. Logan Stewart, 
Teresa and Dana all of May. 
David Tharp and Gary 
Westerman of Rising Star and 
Eloise. Harper of Brownw000d. 

Rada King, Leta Hicks, 
Estella Hudson, Detta Webb, 
Edie Anderson, Mr. and Mrs. 
Skeet Norman of San Angelo, 
Tex., and Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Hughes of Big Springs, Tex., 
were guests of Martha 
Coleman. 

L
tifillratigeWilabialfillil 

• Twilite Acre News 
• Eva Ashworth 

By the Residents 
ativintimintitavitantinium. •••• 	 NIO, •••• elmn. 

Bro. Joe Miller gave good 
reports on the Revival to be 
held in Sidney last week. 

Rada King, Btet Griffin, U.Z. 
Aaron and Howard and 
Laveren Barnes dropped in on 
Alice Gfiffin and Hattie 
Boatman. 

March is still acting like a 
Lion. We've had a few days of 
pretty warm days last week 
tho. Several of the Residents 
enjoyed walking and wheeling 
in the sunshine. 

Scripture Thought Of The Day 

S 

S 
S 
S 

As for my people, children are their oppressors, and 
women rule over them. 0 my people, they that lead 
thee cause theee to err, and destroy the way of thy 
paths. (Isaiah 3:12) Mrs. Beulah Stodghill came 

by for a chat with Omie Hen-
derson and Etta Whitlock. 

Uncle Bob Landreth is in the 
Brownwood Community 
Hospital. 

S 

S 

S 
S 	  

The First Baptist Church of 
May is in the process of 
building a fellowship hall and 
bathrooms and painting the 
church. Also doing some 
repairs on the Parsonage. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Brennan 

of Copperas Cove Tex. spent 
the weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Ashworth and family. 

- - - 
Annie Mae Gotcher's sister, 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Hastings 
had their 50th Wedding An-
niversary over the weekend, 
and most of the family dropped 
by to see Annie. They include. 
Mrs. Mark Jones Alice. Tex., 
Lee Anna Whitten of Amarillo, 
Tex., Odessa and John, Melvin 
and Lee and 

ex.. 
Nina Haybes all of Austin Avenue Church Mr. and Mrs. Clark Yocham, 

Hillsboro, Tex., and Mr. and 
Mrs. Elton James of Lubbock 
Tex. came in to see Leah 
Yocham and Mary Hammett. 

Abilene, T 	Rita. Kerni and 
- - - 

Dolly Clark and Josie 
Hammonds had for visitors last 
week. Rada King, Leta Hicks, 
Mrs. Leory Lyon, Mrs. Olin 
Darland, Mrs. Walter Knox, 
U.Z. Aaron, and Howard and 
Laverne Barnes 

Chad Byrd of Early, Tex. 
Debbie Green and Stacy, Of Christ To Have Series Wendy- Cheerful Byrum- Don 

Ethel Barnes. son and 
daughter- in- law Howard and 
Laverne Barnes were in to see 
Ethel last week. 

- - - 
U.Z. Aaron dropped in to see 

Mary Hort d last week. 
- - - 

George and Detta Webb, 
Donald Chalk Earl Fussell and 
Oiver West visited with Buster 
Rixford and Leo Atkinson. 

a Chalk, Barbara and James 
Gilley, Ronnie Green, and 
Danny White, Hittie Hastings. 
Berna Lee Chick, Mary Har-
per, Edie Anderson and Detta 
Webb, Danny, Debbie, David 
and Derrick White Evelyn 
Chick and Mr. and Mrs. H.S. 
Hinson. 

• March 24 
Joy Harris 
Doyle Herring 
Snovia Walker 
Sha nah Harmon 
Nelda Michael 
Betty Chambers 

March 25 
Laura Louise Hokett 
Joe Crisp 

March 26 
Jamie Long 
Wayna Faye Criswell 

March 27 
Bill Dennard 
Mrs. Slim Harding 
Micki Henderson 
Shirley Parker 
Bre nda Nelson 

March 28 
Woodrow Harris 
Kim Joyce 
James Armstrong 
Ezra McBeth 
Waymon Ware 
C.R. Hart 

March 29 
• Velma Owen 

Goldene Ware 
Vonnie Ware 
Gene Hill 
Thelma Ford 
Kenneth Morrison 

March :to 
Joe Martin 
Tom Grisham 
Denise Lipps 
Fred Price 
Jimmy Christian 

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Vineyard 
and children of Abilene. Tex. 
visited her sister Rev. and Mrs. 
Eddie Martin and her mother 
Mrs. Pauline Taylor. 

Several May folks attended 
the Senior Citizen Open house 
in Brownwood Sunday af-
ternoon. All the personnel were 
introduced and Mayor Truman 
Harlowe told How a "Dream 
Come True for the Senior 
Citizens was accompli'che t. 
Punch and cookies were served 
in the dining room to about 320 
registered guests. 

- - - 
We have a good report from 

some of our May 	ho are in 
the Brownwood Community 
Hospital. Thelma Nelson is 
home. Garland Dewbre is able 
to be up Fele while at a time 
Lois Hardy is Improving and 
Raylene Edwards is still in the 
Hospital. This make 4 weeks for 
her. Hope she will be home 
soon. 

Margie Earp, Opal Hill, 
Beulah Stodghill and U.Z. 
Aaron visited with Martha 
Irby. 

Mrs. Mack Holt went to 
Abilene Monday for tests at 
West Texas Medical Hospital. 

Sook Burnett is still in the 
hospital but improving. 

- - - 
Mrs. Viva Burnett has been 

visiting her son Howard Bur-
nett and family of Graham. 
They brought her home Sat. 
and had a family get to gether 
at her daughter, Cozette Oaks. 
Those attending were Mr. and 
Mrs. J.L. Franklin of Odessa. 

Mrs. Homer West and son, 
Mr. and Mrs. C.O. Young of 
May and Mrs. Bessie Bowers of 
Brownwood came by for a visit 
with Eva West and Ora Jane 
White. 

Mrs. Myrl Ross spent 
Saturday nights with Mrs. 
Grace Glenn. 

- - - 
Mrs. Grace Glenn has just 

gotten home from spending 
several days in Las Vegas. She 
really enjoyed her trip. Mrs. 
Glenn saw several shows, but 
the best show was the 
Liberance show- it was fan-
tastic. Mrs. Glenn took a tour to 
the Hoover Dam and a boat trip 
on Lake Mead- everyone 
should go to Las Vegas, it's 
some place to see. 

Bob and Wilma Lane, 
Howard Gary of Cross Plains 
and Martha Graves of Cisco 
looked in on Annie Burnam and 
Werdna Gary. Mrs. Lane is 
Mrs. Burnams daughter. 

- - - 
Mrs. Oleta Childress of 

Brownfiled Tex., Kenneth Rood 
of Oklahoma City, Wynogene 
Rood of Wichita Falls, Texas. 
Elizabeth Medford U.Z. Aaron 
Darrell, Fredda and Wyna 
Criswell were guests of Susie 
Seals and Bertie Medford. 

Ruth Murphy, Nell Maynard, 
Earl and Clara Epley and Mrs. 
Corbett McDaniel were visitors 
of Doodle McDaniel and Bryant 
Houston. 

Roof Garden Theatre 
To Present 

"The Real Inspector" 

an attorney and city judge in 
Lufkin. and a daughter that 
lives 	in 	Barksdale. 

The selection of the theme 
'Lessons in Living' was made 
with 20th Century man in 
mind," said John Shero, 
minister of the church. "With • 
our extended life and increased 
income, many even in 
Brownwood have not found real 
life," he continued. "These 
sermons will be simple gospel 
messages aimed at bringing 
God's answers to man's 
problems," he concluded. 
"I am looking forward to the 

meeting with much anticipation 
and pleasure. To return to 
Austin Ave. is just like a visit 
back home after a long absence. 
How sweet it is!" stated 

Newman. Ten years of his 
preaching life was spent with 
Austin Ave. having served from 
1939-1944 and from 1954-1959. 

Jack Franks will lead the 
singing for these services. A 
nursery will be staffed and 
available for all services. The 
public is cordially invited to 
attend. 

NEWS RELEASE 
"Lesson's In Living" is the 

theme for this year's 
evangelistic sermon series at 
the Austin Ave. Church of 
Christ, 1020 Austin AVE. in 
Brownwood. The dates for these 
lessons begin Sunday March 20 
and continue through Friday 
March 25th. Services will be at 
the regular times of 10:30 a.m. 
and 6:00 p.m. on Sunday and at 
7:30 p.m. Monday-Friday. 
Herbert Newman, former 

minister at Austin Ave. has 
been invited back as the 
speaker. While attending 
Abilene Christian College in 
1929 he preached his first 
sermon at Buffalo Gap. In his 
ministry he has served the 
Church of Christ in San 
Antonio, Fort Worth. Amarillo. 
Big Spring, Midland, Rvalde, 
and Kilgore in addition to 
Brownwood. He is currently in 
his Sth year as preacher for the 
Church of Christ in Llano. 

Accompaning Mr. Newman to 
Brownwood for the lesson series 
will be his wife Mary. They 
have two children, a son who is 

Arthur and Murel' Lit-
tlefield, Gorman Tex., Jean 
Irene Fisher, Bonnie Campbell 
of Abilene, Luann Campbell, 
Texas Tech, June Moore and 
boys of Abilene. Lita Hicks, 
Rada King Mrs. Jack Millwee, 
mMargaret, and Billy Jack and 
Mary Harper, also Doug and 
Dorotha Sopher of Olton, Tex., 
visited Bett Millwee over the 
weekend. 

- - - 
Edie Anderson, Delta Webb, 

Mrs. Joe Fleming, Mrs. Mark 
Jones, Alice, Tex- Mr. and 
Mrs. H.S. Hinson of Stamford, 
Tex., and r. and Mrs. Oliver 
West, Olivia and Amy visited 
Emma West and Nancy 
Mathews. 

- - - 
The Prayer Circle Group 

entertained us Wednesday 
afternoon with a film and Bible 
Study. Several songs was sang 
by the Group and Residents. 
Mrs. Margie Earp played the 
piano for us. Thanks to all. 

- - - 
Mrs. Edna Barnes was kinda 

sa- d the last of thw week, as 
her Granddaughter, Mary and 
Lonnard Wonsyld of Oregon 
were down and returned home 
Friday. Rada King, T.T. 
Barnes and U.Z Aaron visited 
with Mattie Knight and Edna 
Barnes. 

Hank Wilson enjoyed Sunday 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Clinton Wilson. Clinton's son, 
Larry and Rita Wilson and boys 
and Mr. and Mrs. Archie Rowe 
of Midland were visitors also 

Let me leave vou with this 
little saying. Who 1,-1 man tries 
himself- the verdict is in his 
favor. 

Mrs. June Moore and Boys of 
Abilene Texas was in to see her 
father, Neman Jones and Carl 
Irby. 
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PLASTIC STRAWS 
REACHING TO 
ROOT BOTTOM 
HELP PLANTS 
BREATHE. 

One of the most suc-
cessful plays of the 1972 
New York season, "The 
Real Inspector Hound," is 
the upcoming attraction at 
the Roof Garden Dinner 
Theater for the evenings of 
March 26, 27 and 28 ac-
cording to an an-
nouncement by Cisco 
Junior College Drama 
Director Mary Reed. The 
CJC Fine Arts Department 
produces the various plays 
and other entertainment 
events at the Roof Garden 
Theater. 	• 

The shows on Saturday 
and Sunday evenings, 
March 26, and 27, are 
scheduled to begin with 
dinner at 7:30 p.m. The 
Monday evening per-
formance on March 28 will 
be a dessert show. Prices 
are $6.00 for the dinner-
show combinations and 
$2.50 for the dessert show. 
Although Monday is set as 
"student night," others will 
be welcome providing seats 
are available, Mrs. Reed 
said. 

Reservations are 
necessary for all per-
formances, and may be 
made by calling 442- 2567. 
Also cancellations should be 
made no later than the day 
prior to the performance 
Mrs. Reed stated. The 
college switchboard is open 
until 5:00 daily. 

The Saturday and Sunday 
menu will consist of tossed 
salad, filet mignon, baked 
potato, English peas with 
pearl onions, rolls, butter, 
key lime pie and tea or 
coffee. 

"The Real Inspector 
Hound" begins with two 
drama critics- - Birdboot 
and Moon- - sitting in a box 
at the premiere of an old-
fashioned mystery-
melodrama. The play they 
are watching takes place in 
the drawing room of an old 
Gothic mansion. Moon• a 
second- string ctitic. suf-
fering from extreme 
paranoia about his un- 
derstdy status, wishes his 
superior a slow but certain 
death. The other. Birdboot, 
is an established critic who 
is not avove trading a good 
review for the favors of a 
desirable young actress. 
Both men are on 

assignment to review an 
Agatha Christie- type 
thriller, full of maids. 
revolvers and dead bodies. 

The action on stage, 
abounding in deliberate 
cliches, is interspersed with 
cynical comments and 
asides from the critics, who 
seem to be more involved 
with their own problems 
than the play. Occasionally, 
however, they realize why 
they are there and burst 
forth with a perperly 
literary bit of exposition. 

This situation accelerates 
with mounting insantiy as 
Birdboot cannot resist 
answering ' a 	stage 
telephone, -discovers the 
call is for him- - and so, 
becomes caught up in the 
action. The call becomes a 
life or death matter as he 
and Moon pass from being 
observers to being par-
ticipants in the play. 

At the Roof Garden 
Theater, James Day and 
Steve Johnson ' (Birdboot 
and Moon) will be seen as 
the two drama critics whose 
attention to the play-
within- a- play is minimal 
to begin with but grows in 
importance as they become 
a part of the action. Daniell 
Eaves and Sherry Bryant 
(Cynthia and Felicity) will 
play the leading lady and 
the ingenue whose beauty 
and desirability prompt Mr. 
James Day's (Birdboot's) 
entrance on stage. Kathy 
Edwards (Mrs. Drudge), as 
the housekeeper, has the 
important task of turning on 
the radio in time for an-

nouncements such as 
"Essex County Police are 
still searching in vain for 
the madman who is at large 
in the deadly marshes of the 
coastal region." Others 
taking part in the show will 
be: 	Tony 	Miller ( In- 
spector Hound), George 
Broom (Mangus), Dale 
Fuller (Simon Gascoyne), 
Jolinda Chisum ( The 
Body), Wyley Pebbles 
(BBC Voice), and Kelley 
Stewart is the student 
director 	and 	stage 
manager. 

Mrs. Mary Reed. as 
director, is setting the light 
and airy pace for this farce 
and Mr. Fred Mullinax is 

desiging the ominous 
drawing room where the 
play- within- a- play takes 
place. 

NOUSE PLANT NAPPY?-:zc 
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MISTING AND PROTECTING YOUR MANY HOUSE 

PLANTS IS EASIER, FASTER, MORE EFFICIENT 
WITH A CORDLESS ELECTRIC SPRAYER. 

AUCTION 
Saturday, March 26, 1977 

10:30 A.M. 
C.M. McCain- Estate 

Eastland, Texas 
Located 4 Miles South Of Eastland On Hwy. 6 
"706" I.H.C. Diesel Tractor (Good) 
"841" Ford Diesel Tractor 
1970 Ford Pickup 
1955 Chevrolet Grain Truck W- Hoist 
"M- M" 12 ft. Grain Drill 
11 ft. "Ford" Tandem Disc. 
2 Row "Ford" Planter 
2 Row "Ford Cultivator 
ti Shank and 9 shank Chisel Plow 
3 row Lister 
3 Bt. Moldboard 
3 Disc. Breaking Plow 
12 Disc "A- C" One- way 
New Holland "275" Hay Baler 
Shredder 
20ft. Tandem Hay Trailer 
6 x 20 ft. Gooseneck Trailer W- Detachable Sideboards 
500 Gal. Propane Tank (Trailer Mounted) 
1,000 Ga. Diesel Tank w- Electric pump 
Irrigation pump & Motor (Trailer Mounted) 
(2) Pump Jacks) 
190 Joints of 3. 4- 5 Irrigation Pipe 
1,000 Ft. of 2" Steel Pipe 
Plus Tractor Weights, Grain Auger, (2) Trailer Axles, Por- 
table Electric Welder, (2) la ton and la ton chain hoist, Cross 
Ties, Hand Tools, Pridle, Saddle, Boat, Motor, Trailer, Some 
Household Furnishings and many, many more items too 
numerous to list. Loader Tractor available- no charge- 
courtesy of Auctioneer. 
For Further Information Contact: Troy Johnson 817- 734- 
5367- Gorman, Texas. 

Lunch available 

Col-Tex Herring 
Lic. TXGS-77-0258 
(FuN Time Auctioneer) 

Phone 915-583-2244 
P. 0. Box SS 

Lawn, Texas 79530 



Work Is Progressing On 
New Sanitary Landfill 

Entrance to the new dump ground- - the roan 
is bordered on the right by landowner Wilbur 
Caudle and on th left by Ray Agnew. 
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TEXAS OFFICE OF TRAFFIC SAFETY 

Mar. 21—Apr. 19 
ARIES (Mar. 21 to Apr. 19): Emotional trouble can be 
compounded by heavy traffic Let traffic thin before 
starting home 

TAURUS (Apr. 20 to May 20): Time to put away child-
ish things. Mementos hanging from your rearview 
mirror only serve as distractions 

GEMINI (May 21 to June 21): Can the common cold 
be fatal? It can if your normal alertness is dimmed by 
the side effects of a cough. 

CANCER (June 22 to July 21): A bad habit can be 
distracting. Curtail smoking lest you drop a lighted cig-
arette while driving in heavy traffic. 

LEO (July 22 to Aug. 21): You may be tempted to 
roar in spite of bad driving conditions Slow down on 
slick streets. 

VIRGO (Aug. 22 to Sept. 22): Be prepared for sudden 
danger Make sure your seat belt is buckled before you 
start rolling 

LIBRA (Sept. 23 to Oct. 22): Don't be too trusting or 
take anything for granted There may be danger to you 
from cars running red lights 

SCORPIO (Oct. 23 to Nov. 21): Someone may 
attempt to victimize you soon Make sure you lock your 
car when you go shopping 

SAGITTARIUS (Nov. 22 to Dec. 21): You like singing 
along with a tune, but don t let your car radio take your 
mind off driving. 

CAPRICORN (Dec. 22 to Jan. 20): Look out for 
significant additions to your life routine, like a stop sign 
on a previously unmarked intersection 

AQUARIUS (Jan. 21 to Feb. 19): An adventurous 
mood may lead you down unknown byways Be alert 
for new hazards 

PISCES (Feb. 20 to Mar. 20): An agitated mental state 
may cause you to blow trifling traffic incidents up to 
major proportions. Keep your control 

A Theft Policy 
r71. 

• A  

0 cc 

2907 JULY'74 M.P. 31 

Sure You're Insured 
To Replace Losses? 

Bad as it is to be burgled, 
it's worse to discover too 
late . .. that your coverage 

wasn't adequate. Call 
us for an update .. . 

Jenkins 
Isurance Agency 
Phone 817-643-2251 

"'Rising  Star, Texas 

I. 

Thursday, March 24, 1977 

Oil News PEANUT PRODUCERS 
We are sorry we can no longer book CRUSTBUSTER Medium 

certified Starr seed this year. 

CRUSTBUSTER Regular Certified Starr seed are united. 

Spanish peanut seed are becoming scarce, however, we can 
still book high quality spanish seed for you. 

Florunner seed are plentiful at this time for your booking. 

We would also like to book any other fieWseed for you to 
insure you of high quaity planting seed. 

Farmers Supply 
Homer West Morris DeLong 

Seed Fertilizer Feed 

A Coleman County wildcat 
drilled seven miles north of 
Tapha has been completed as a 
lower Fry gas dicovery. 
It is Chaparra Minerals Inc. of 

Abilene No. I McCulloch 
McCord, spotting 1.600 feet 
from the south and 1,407 feet 
from the west lines of Section 
41, BBB&C Survey. 
Absolute, open flow was 

1,300.000 cubic feet of dry gas 
daily from perforations at 
3.503-11 feet. The pay was 
treated with 1.000 gallons of 
acid. 
Operator set the 41/2  inch 

casing at 3,818 feet. Total depth 
was 3,974 feet. and plugged 
back to 3.590 feet. 
Chaparral (Lower Fry) Field is 

the suggested name. 

H.L. Neeb of Abilene 
completed No. 2 Jim Bob 
Thweatt in the Caraway 
Jennings Sand) Field two miles 
east of Fisk. 
Location is 330 feet from the 

north and 6.452 feet from the 
east lines of Abraham Byrd 
Survey 74. 
It had an absolute, open flow 

of 4.900,000 cubic feet of dry 
gas dialy from perforations at 
2.093-95 feet. 
Operator set the 41/2  inch 

casing sat 2,18-4 feet, one foot 
off bottom. 

Eastland--Sentinel Petroleum 
co. of Bedford will drill No. 1 
J.C. Thurman as a proposed 
3,995-foot wildcat five miles 
southeast of Cisco. 
Drillsite is 467 feet from the 
north and 2.173 feet from the 
west lines of Section 28, Block, 
H&TC Survey. 
The lease is composed of 40 

acres. 

Future sight of the sanitary landfill located 
two miles northeast of the city just off cemetery -
road. Shown above is the test pit dug some weeks 
ago. 

NARFE To Hold 
Dinner Meeting 

The NAREE (National 
Association of Retired Federal 
Employees) will hold a meeting 
Monday evening. March 28th at 
6:30 in the Ramada Inn in 
Eastland. 
Following the dinner meal, a 

program will be presented by 
James Wood, instructor at 
Ranger Junior College who was 
present for the last meeting. 
He will give a continuation of 
his 	last 	presentation 
"Emergency Medical Service" 
and will be assisted by two 
registered nurses. 
Visitors are welcome for the 

program and urged to attend 
this interesting program. 

Work was begun on the new 
sanitary 	landfill 	located 
approximately 2 miles northeast 
of Rising Star. just off the 
Cemetery Road in late October 
or early November of last year. 
A new location was sought by 
the City due to a number of 
State requirements and 
restrictions placed upon them 
following inspection by the 
Health Department., 

The sight for the landfill is 
located on property presently 
owned by the State of Texas. 
The city acquired a ten year 
lease with the option to buy if it 
is ever sold by the state. Once 
the location was found and a 
right of way acquired from Ray 

Agnew, work was begun on a 
road which leads to the sight. 
City employees built a 8 foot 
road which has been caliched 
and is completed to the location. 
The test pit which has been 

dug caught a measureable 
amount of percipitation in a rain 
some-time ago. This pit when 
completed, will cover some 20 
feet. comprised of some sand 
and fourteen feet of clay. 
Hubbard Construction 
Contractors will begin work on 
the actual pit in the near future 
and once this is finished, a 
fence will be erected and the 
facility will be in operation. The 
pit will he covered once a month 
and no buring will be allowed. 
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Perform a 
death- 
defying 
act. 

West Artesia Transmission 
Co. of San Antonio completed 
two regular field wells eight 
miles northwest of Cisco. 
No. 2 Bobby Moore spots 1,530 

feet from the north and 330 feet 
from the east lines of Section 
2983, TE&L Survey. 
Absolute open flow was 

3,730,000 cubic feet of gas daily 
with a gas-liquid, hydrccarbon 
ratio of 140,000-1 of 51 gravity. 
Production 	is 	from 

perforations at 3,744t/ -481/2  
feet. fractured with 5.000 
gallons of fluid. 
Operator set the 41/2  inch 

casing at 4.031 feet. six feet off 
bottom. 

Other well is No. 1 Marie Cote. 
et al, spotting 1,704 feet from 
the north and 660 feet from the 
east lines of Section 2979 TE&L 
Survey. 
It had an absolute open flow of 

600.000 cubic feet of dry gas 
daily from perforations at 
3,574-79 feet, treated with 300 
gallons of acid. 
Operator set the 41/2  inch 

casing at 3.891 feet. Total 
depth at 3,891 feet. Total depth 
was 4,325 feet, and plugged 
back to 3,891. feet. 
An Eastland County wildcat 

drilled three miles northwest of 
Eastland has been completed 
and prorated in the regular 
field. 
It is Welcome Well Service and 

Boykin Brothers of Abilene No. 
1 Downtain Estate. 
Location is 400 feet from the 

south and west lines of the 
northwest quarter of Section 35, 
Block 4 H&TL Survey. 
Dail) potential was nine 

barrels of 40 gravity oil, plus 
three barrels of water. 
Production 	is 	from 

perforations at 3,797 to 3.809 
feet, treated with 500 gallosn of 
mud acid. The pay was 
fractured with 3,000 gallons of 
fluid. 
Operator set the 51/2  inch 

casing at 3,872 feet. Total depth 
was 4,061 feet, and plugged 
back to 3,836 feet. 

GeoDynamics Oil &Gas Inc. 
of Brownwood will drill No. 2 
B.C.G. Stroebel in the Foster 
(Marble Falls) Field six miles 
north of Rising Star. 

The planned 3.000-foot 
venture is located on a 100 acre 
lease. 
It spots 1,360 feet from the 

north and 6,178 feet from the 
east lines of John F. Sapp 
Survey 	34, 	A-435. 

Give 
r I 
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Geo- Dynamics Oil & Gas 
Inc. of Brownwood will drill No. 
3 W.E. Murphree in the BBB&C 
Blk, 3 (Marble Falls) Field six 
miles northwest of May in 
Brown County. 

The planned 2,900 foot ven-
ture is located ona 40 acre 
lease. 

Drillsite is 730 feet from the 
south and 625 feet from the east 
lines of Lot 17, H.P. Brewster 
Survey 790. 

West Artesia Transmission 
Co. of San Antonio completed 
No. 1 Yeager in the regular field 
eilght miles northwest of Cisco. 
It spots 330 feet from the south 

and 2,300 feet from the west 
lines of Section 478. SP Survey. 
Absolute. open flow was 

13,000.000 cubic feet of gas 
daily. It had a gas-liquid, 
hy-drocarbon ratio of 151.2004 
of 63 gravity. 
Production is from perforatins 

at 3.940-44 feet, fractured with 
220 barrels of water and 10.000 
pounds of sand. 
Operator set the 41/2  inch 

casing at 3.980 feet. Total 
depth was 4.192 feet and 
plugged back to 3.980 feet. 

Rhodes Drilling Co. of Abilene 
completed No. 2 (formerly No. 
2-A) Pat Agnew in Eastland 
County Regular Field six miles 
northeast of Rising Star. 
Locations is 4,705 feet from the 

south and 1.918 feet from the 
east lines of John F. Sapp 
Survey 34, A-435. 
Daily potential was 77 barrels 

of 42 gravity oil, plus 29 barrels 
of water. Flow as through a 
10-64 inch choke with 700 
pounds casing and 420 pounds 
tubing pressures. 
Production 	is 	from 

perforations at 2,932-38 feet. 
treated with SOO gallons of mud 
acid. The pay was fratured with 
300 sacks of sand. 
Operator set the 41/2  inch 

casing at 3,000 feet. Total 
dedpth is 3,005 feet. 
Gas oil ratio was 2,597-1. 

George L. Buckles Co. of 
Monahans completed two 
regular field wells in the county. 
No. 1-A Harrison is four miles 

northwest of Desdemona. 
It spots 3.375 feet from the 

north and 7,878 feet from the 
east lines of Abraham Smelzer 
Survey A-431. 
It had a daily pumping 

potential of 31 barrels of 41 
gravity oil pumping from an 
open hole at 2,721-68 feet. The 
pay was fractured with 7,500 
gallons of oil. 

The firm's No. 1 Morris is five 
miles north of Pioneer, spotting 
1,410 feet from the north and 
671 feet from the east lines of 
Samuel Damon Survey A-81. 
Daily pumping potential was 

11 barrels of 41 gravity oil from 
an open hole at 2,613-41 feet. 

Courtship Is -- A man pursuing a woman until she catches 
him 

Have 
regular 
medical 
check-ups. 
Edition Of "Wonderful 
West Texas" Available 
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CHEESE 
12 oz. 	2 lb 

49c 89c 

Rising Star 
We Reserve The Right To Limit Quanities 

Store Hours: 7:30 cm. to 7:00 p.m. 
Sale Starts Thursday March 24 Continues Thru 

Wednesday ,March 30, 1977 

Double Stamps Wednesday 
Hunts 

TOMATO SAUCE 
8 oz. 

5 for 90° 

Zee 

NICE & SOFT 
4 roll Tissue 79C  

DOG Purina  
CHOW 

a $1" 
Texas 

GRAPEFRUIT 
8  for  P°  
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ORANGES 
19` 6.  

FRYERS 

47`..  TIDE 
King  

$199  

Gandy's 

FROZAN 

Z,„ $1® Arm & Hammer 

DETERGENT 
29  

2 QUARTS Of COKE FREE... 
With purchase 

of 4 quarts 
of MnPIBB 

$109 
Gandy's 

ORANGE 
DRINK 

1 gallon  79` 
DETAILS WIEFIF 
YOU SW FOP 
COCA-COLA AMPS PIES 

32 oz. Returns 	tiles 

Hunts 

CATSUP 
32 oz. 

88C 
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Robert D. Woofter. Chairman 
of the West Texas Chamber of 
Commerce Tourist and Travel 
Development 	Committee. 
reports that the fourth edition of 
the WTCC "Wonderful West 
Texas" Fun and Adventure 
Map was released March 13 at 
the Dallas Sports and Vacation 
Show. 
The Fun and Adventure Map 

is the feature travel publication 
for the WTCC providing travel 
information for the 132-county 
WTCC service area. Quantity 
production enables a mass 
distribution program to be 
carried out utilizing direct mail. 
Texas 	highway 	Tourist 
Information Centers, travel 
shows. paricipating auto clubs 
and other interested travel 
related groups. 
Woofter. president and Chief 
Executive Officer of Community 
Public Service Company 
headquartered in Fort Worth, 
stated. "that all inquiries 
received by the WTCC Travel 
Development 	Department 
receive a copy of the Fun and 
Adventure Map in addition to 
any 	special 	information 
requested." A minimum of 
100.000 copies of the 
publication are distributed 
annually. 
Sixty-nine points of interest 

arc highlighted in the 1977 
edition number keyed for the 
visitors convenience on a 
colorful travel map of West 
Texas. Woofter noted. "that by 
consulting 	thefun 	and 
Adventure Map many fine 
attractions arc called to one's 
attention that might otherwise 
he overlooked and that use of 
the map in vacation planning 
can save time. fuel and 
money. 
The publication features areas 

of interest. museums and 
colleges and universities along 
with a list of state parks located 
in West Texas and other 
interesting travel information. 
For a free copy of the 

"Wonderful West Texas" Fun 
and Adventure Map write: 
West Texas Chamber of 
Commerce, P.O. Box 1561, 
Abilene, Texas 79604. 
Advertising rates are available 
upon request. 
Advertisers in the 1977 edition 

include: 
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ATTRACTIONS AND AREAS 
OF INTEREST--Abilene, Alamo 
Village, Brackettville; Alpine, 
Amarillo, 	Arlington, 
Balmorhea. Big Bend National 
Park. Chisos Mountains Lodge. 
big Spring. Brady, Brownwood, 
Carlsbad. New Mexico; Caverns 
of Sonora, Colorado City, 
Crowell, Del Rio, Dumas. El 
Paso. Graham, Guadalupe 
Mountains National Park. 
Hereford, Iraan, Kermit, 
Kerrville. Menard, Midland. 
Monahans, Odessa, Quanah. 
San Angelo. Snyder, Stamford, 
Stephenville, Sweetwater, 
"Texas". Palo Duro Canyon; 
Vernon, Six Flags Over Texas. 
Wichita Falls. 
MUSEUMS- -Annie Rigs 

Memorial Museum, For 
Stockton: Big Spring Heritage 
Museum, Carson County 
Square Shouse Museum. 
Panhandle; Colorado City 
Historical Museum, Diamond 
M Museum. Snyder; El Paso 
Centennial Museum, Fort 
Concho Museum. San Aneglo: 
Fort Richardson State park 
Museum, acksboro; Fort Worth 
Art 	Museum, 	General 
Telephone's E.H. Danner 
Museum of Telephony, San 
Angelo: Permian Basin 
Petroleum Museum. Midland: 
Seagraves-Loop Museum and 
Art Center. 
COLLEGES 	AND 

UNIVERITIES Abilene 
Christian University. Angelo 
State University. San Angelo: 
Baylor University. Waco: 
Hardin-Simmons 
-Abilene: Howard College. Big 
Spring McMurry. Abilene: 
Midland College. Rolling Plains 
Campus TSTI. Sweetwater; Sul 
Ross State University, Alpine; 
Tarleton State University. 
Alpine: 	Tarleton 	State 
University. 	Stephenville; 
Tarrant County Junior College. 
Fort Worth; Texas Christian 
Univeristy. Fort Worth; Texas 
Tech University, Lubbock; 
Texas Wesleyan College. Fort 
Worth: Texas Woman's 
University, Denton; The 
University of Texas atk 
Arlington; The University of 
Texas at El Paso; The 
University of Texas of the 
Permian Basin. Odessa; West 
Texas State University, Canyon; 
Western Texas College Snyder. 
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