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"Sound Economic Growth" 
Established in 1890 

Band To Participate 
In QC Concert 

handle the 200 plus music.arfielyAciteER d In Local Bank Report 

Meteorological happenings 
on Monday, surprising as they 

4 were, proved one point at least 
- - the rain making process is 
still functioning. The moisture 
that fell, though inadequate, 
was most welcome, and it is 
hoped that this, like the robin, 
is a harbinger of something 
better, like a three or four inch 
soaker. 

Coming events to watch for: 
a Bicentennial Concert on 
Thursday evening at Cisco 
Junior College. The Rising Star 
Band under the direction of 
Paul Fullerton will participate. 

N.D. CHANCELLOR 
Candidate for Constable 

The annual Chamber of 
Commerce Banquet has ten-
tatively been set for February 
24, pending confirmation of the 
invited speaker. Details will be 
made available at a later date. 

A spectacular concert 
combining the seven school and 
college bands of Eastland 
County will be held on Thur-
sday evening, January 22, at 
the Cisco Junior College 
Auditorium. The program is set 
for 7:30 p.m. 

The concert is planned as a 
Bicentennial event, and is the 
second in Cisco Junior 
College's Bicentennial Series 
for 1975 - 76. CJC Band 
Director Douglas Fry is 
coordinating the program. 

High school bands from 
Cisco, Eastland, Ranger, 
Gorman, and Rising Star will 
participate, as will the junior 
college bands from Cisco and 
Ranger. Each of the directors 
from the various schools will 
conduct one selection on the 
program. 

Stage crew personnel at CJC 
are currently building a special 
stage extension out into the 
auditorium's orchestra pit to 

H. W. Simpson 
Buried Here 

Chancellor Announces 
For Constable 

A program on March 2, in 
which the "Kaleidoscope of 
Freedom" flags will be 
presented, to Colonel Russell 
Fudge, director ,of the 
Academy of Freedom in 
Brownwood. The flags will be 
on display at the Academy 
during the remainder of this 
Bicentennial year. 

More information on this 
event will be forthcoming. 

He is single and has been a 
resident of Eastland County for 
the past 40 years. 

Mr. Chancellor attended 
Hardin - Simmons University 
and is . a graduate of Cisco 
Junior College. 

N.C. 	Chancellor 	has 
authorized this newspaper to 
announce his candidacy for 
Constable of Precinct 3 in 
Eastland County. 

Chancellor is presently 
employed by the Atlantic 
Drilling Company. 

Federal Retirees Plan 
Dinner Meeting 

* * * 

stimulating local economic 
activity, were about the same 
as the total of a year ago, and 
roughly 53 percent of deposits. 
This is considered a healthful 
ratio, Rutherford explained. 
Earlier in the year and largely 
due to the disappointing peanut 
crop yields of a year ago, the 
ratio was nearer 75 percent. 
The subsequent liquidation of 
much of this percentage is 
another gratifying indicator of 
the economic well - being of the 
community. 

Another fact of interest 
reflected from the statement of 
condition is that approximately 
one - half of the more than $9 
millions in deposits is money 
saved by the depositors. 
Demand, or checking account 
deposits, were reported as 
$4,362,510.29, while time and 
savings accounts and cer-
tificates of deposit accrue to 
$4,660,061.70 distributed in 
ownership among ap-
proximately 500 customers in 
amounts ranging from $100,000 
to $500, a not inconsequential 
item of community financial 
stability. 

The bank management views 
the year ahead with an outlook 
clouded only by a present lack 
of rainfall. Small grains and 
spring grasses are suffering for 
moisture and substantial rains 
are needed to provide a good 
bottom season for next fall's 
peanut crop, said Rutherford 

But the history of the area, 
weatherwise, suggests that 
there is still time for hope. 

yield of 1973 and far better than 
the return from the spotty 
harvest of 1974, so much of 
which was left in the fields to 
untimely rains. 

But for the depressed con-
dition of the livestock market 
the bank resources would 
undoubtedly have increased 
more than quoted. Livestock is 
the area's basic economic 
resource. The gradual im-
provement now taking place in 
prices for cattle and other 
livestock is one reason for an 
optimistic 	forecast 	of 
agricultural prosperity here in 
1976, Rutherford said. 

However, the farms and 
ranches of the area are not the 
only contributors to the good 
economic picture offered by the 
bank's year - end figures. A 
great increase in drilling for oil 
and gas, spurred by high 
energy prices, has virtually 
wiped out unemployment in the 
Rising Star country and 
brought in many thousands of 
continuing dollars, mostly in 
wages, the banker said. This is 
having a significant effect upon 
the bank's assets, and all signs 
indicate it will do so in-
definitely. 

These assets, as recited in the 
December 31 statement just 
issued, totalled $9,952,238.95. A 
year ago the corresponding 
figure was $9,203,203.76, a 
difference of only slightly less 
than $750,000.00. 

Loans of $5,011.089.49, 
representing that part of the 
bank assets actually at work in The National Association of 

Retired Federal Employees, 
Chapter 555, will hold the first 

Reflecting a sound economic 
growth for the Rising Star area 
- - inflation's deceptive in-
fluence notwithstanding - - the 
First State Bank here in its 
December 31st statement of 
condition reported assets that 
were three - quarters of a 
million dollars above those 
reported a year ago. 

Most of the increase - -
$733,177.58, as a matter of fact 
- - represented a growth in 
customer deposits, including 
both demand and time and 
savings accounts. This, in turn, 
was due largely to an increase 
in farm and ranch income, the 
most of it peanut harvest 
money of which a record $3 
million was handled through 
the bank during the season. At 
peak last fall the bank's 
deposits, under this influence, 
were well above the $10 million 
mark, but payment of loans, 
machinery mortgages and 
other deferred costs of crop -
making reduced this figure 
until by December 31, 1975, 
they had settled to an amount 
reported as $9,022,571.99. This 
compares with deposits of 
$8,289,394.41 reported twelve 
months ago. 

The climb took place despite 
the fact that 1975 was not a 
particularly good peanut 
season, President James 
Rutherford pointed out. A 
summer drouth reduced crop 
volume but extremely good 
grades and an increase in 
prices made the harvest just 
completed a much better one 
dollar - wise than the excellent 

Farmers Union Plans meeting of the New Year 
Monday night, January 26, 
1976. The dinner meeting will 
be at 6 p.m. at the Ramada Inn 
in Eastland, followed by a 7 
p.m. program. Mr. and Mrs. Al 
Van de Putte of Ranger will 
furnish the program. 

President Aubrey Goss of 
Rising Star will preside over a 
short business session. Pending 

Gagers Win First Did-riga Game 

making up the county band. 
Selections and directors for 

the concert will include: 
"The Star Spangled Banner", 

Sousa 	- Damrosh 
arrangement, directed by Mr. 
Douglas Fry of Cisco Junior 
College; 

"America 1776" by Billings, 
directed by Mr. Paul Fullerton 
of Rising Star; 

"Duty, Honor, County" by 
Harold L. Walters and narrated 
by Wyley Peebles, chairman of 
the Fine Arts Department of 
CJC, directed by Mr. Andy 
Taylor of Gorman; 

"The Stars and Stripes 
Forver" by John Philip Sousa, 
directed by Mr. Arthur Nutt of 
Ranger High School; 

"Ceremony of Allegiance" by 
Don Gillis, with narration by 
Mr. Peebles, directed by Mr. 
Jerry Frazier of Ranger Junior 
College; 

"The Blue and the Gray", 
civil war fantasy by Clare 
Grundman, directed by Mr. G. 
Lynn Low of Cisco High School; 
and 

"America the Beautiful" by 
Carmen Dragon, directed by 
Mr. Bobby Bingham of 
Eastland. 

Mr. Peebles will serve as 
master of ceremonies for the 
concert. 

There will be no charge for 
admission, and the general 
public has been cordially in-
vited to attend the concert. 
Seating will be on a first come, 
first serve basis, Mr. Fry said. 

Wednesday 
Services For 
Ross I ammna 

Thursday Meeting KEN HOUNSEL 

legislation concerning retirees 
will be discussed and plans 
made for the programs pnd 
projects for the NARFE 
meetings held each last 
Monday night through 
November. All members and 
area Civil Service Retirees 
interested in the organization 
are urged to attend. No 
reservations are necessary for 
the dinner. The $3.00 fee will 
include the tax and tip and 
visitors are always welcome. 

Mrs. Trout Seeks Re-election 

Harvey Wear Simpson, 81, 
former owner and operator of a 
Rising Star laundry, died at 9 
9:50 a.m. Wednesday in Black-
well Hospital in Gorman. 

Services were held at 2:30 
p.m. Thursday in Higgin-
botham Funeral Home Chapel. 

The Rev. Dick Williams, 
pastor of First Baptist Church, 
officiated. Burial was in Rising 
Star Cemetery. 

Born Feb. 18, 1894, in Travis 
County, he married Nettie 
Killebrew in 1922 in Lampasas. 
For 20 years, he ran Simpson's 
Laundry here. Mr. Simpson 
was a Baptist and a veteran of 
World War I. 

Survivors include his wife; 
two sons, Elmon of Cheybogan, 
Mich., and Ferdinand of 
Harlingen; two daughters, 
Joyce Wrinkle of Levelland and 
Vernell Creech of Rising Star; 
a brother, Jim of Austin; and 
three-  sisters, Mrs. James 
Selvester of Yoakum, Lou 
Moore of Round Rock, and 
Survilla Canteell of Dallas; 
nine grandchildren; and eight 
great - grandchildren. 

Three brothers and four 
sisters preceded him in death. 

The Eastland County Far-
mers' Union will meet at 7:00 
p.m. on Thursday evening, 
November 22, at the Pantry 
Cafe in Gorman. 

Larry Armstrong of Eastland 
will present a program on 
Farmers' Retirement Income 
and other insurance related 
matters. Mr. Armstrong is the 
insurance agent for the 
Eastland County Farmers' 
Union. 

Everyone is welcome to 
attend this important meeting. 

Mrs. Nancy Trout has 
authorized this newspaper to 
announce that she is a can-
didate for re - election to the 
office of Eastland County Tax 
Assessor - Collector. 

Mrs. Trout was chief deputy 
for Edgar Altom and upon his 
retirement, wastelected to the 
office. 

Mrs. Trout said that she will 
issue a formal statement at a 
later date. drive 

norp,/tsc/do 
• erd f91' Eastland County 4-Hers Plan Activities 

Wheeler Ross Hammett, 87, a 
retired Rising Star farmer, 
died at 4:20 a.m. Tuesday in 
Eastland Manor Nursing 
Home after a brief illness. 

Services were at 2 p.m. 
Wednesday at Higginbotham 
Funeral Home Chapel. 

Audi& Moore, Church of 
Christ minister, officiated. 
Burial was in Rising Star 
Cemetery. 

Born Dec. 31, 1888, in Okra, 
he married Mary F. Gaddis in 
1907 in Rising Star. He was a 
farmer all of his life. 

Survivors include his wife; 
and a brother, Claude of 
Borger. 

A daughter, a brother and 
five sisters preceded him in 
death. 

The Eastland County 4- H 
Council met recently. Plans for 

' 	county - wide 4 - H activities 
were made by the club 
representatives. 

Sarah Slaton of Gorman 4 - H 
Club, was elected as treasurer 
for the Council. 

Jeanne Hounsel of Rising 
Star 4 - H Club, Revise 
Laminack of Gorman 4 - H 
Club, gave a report on the 
District 4 - H Council meeting 

all. Pam Hill hit 21 points, 
Laurie Hill 15, and Jeanne 
Hounsel 9. The girls now arc 16 
- 7 on the year. 

The boys standing 3 - 16 lose 
78 - 47 as Robert Underwood 
and Mackey Elliott hit 16 and 10 
respectively. 

In the Super Bowl, Dallas 
finally lost 21 - 17 to Pittsburgh. 
Considering the Cowboys 
started the year with 12 
rookies, losing Bob Lilley, 
Calvin Hill, Dave Manders, and 
others in 1974, but still having a 
10 - 4 year and beating 12 - 2 
Minnesota, 12 - 2 Los Angeles 
(pre - season NFL champ 
favorites), 	St. 	Louis, 
Washington, and others and 
getting to Super Bowl, it's been 
a pretty good year. Tom 
Landry, this one Dallas fan 
salutes you. 

Last week in the district: 
Boys, Gorman 84, Carbon 48; 
Putnam 74, Moran 52; Gorman 
53, Putnam 38. 

Girls - - Carbon 54, Gorman 
41. The district now stands in 
boys: Gorman 3 - 0, Putnam 2 
- 1, Rising Star 1 - 2, Moran 1 - 
2 and Putnam 1 - 2. In girls: 
Moran 2 - 0, Rising Star 2 - 1, 
Carbon 1 - 2 and Gorman 0 - 2. 

This week on Monday, Rising 
Star host Putnam boys and 
Moran host Gorman and 
Thursday, Moran at Rising 
Star and Putnam vs. Carbon 
(boys.) 

Last Monday Cats lost three 
times to Bangs, J.V. boys lost 
76 - 56 as Lamar Gregg lead 
with 21 points. The girls lost 50 
- 45 in a good game which saw 
the girls trailing until the fourth 
quarter in which they tied at 43 

The Rising Star Wildcat boys 
won their first District 24B 
game as they beat Carbon last 
Thursday, 66 - 53. Mackey 
Elliott hit 18 of his 26 points in 
the first half as the Cats lead 42 
- 24 at the half. Robert Un-
derwood hit 21 points in the 
victory cause also. 

In the girls game, Pam Hill 
hit 43 points in leading the girls 
to a 62 - 57 	win. Hill is 
averaging 32 points per district 
contest. Laurie Hill added 14 
points and Jeanne Hounsel 5. 
The girls now stand at 2 - 1 on 
District. If the girls win the rest 
of their district games, which 
they can, and Moran loses to 
Carbon or Gorman, the Cats 
will win the District. If Moran 
doesn't lose and the Cats win 
the rest, a playoff will decide 
the district representatives to 
the playoffs. 

44  Farmers Losing Control 
Of Ag Policy 

they attended in Hamilton. 
Other plans made by the 

Council members included 
planning an end of the year 
trip. The 4 - Hers plan to visit 
Pate Museum of Tran-
sportation for an overnight trip 
and other sights in the Fort 
Stiorth - Dallas area. 

Jeanne Hounsel will prepare 
news of Eastland County 4- H 
activities for the District 4 - H 
news letter. 

Council members attending 
the meeting were: Theresa 
Scott, Neil Scott, Jeanne 
Hounsel, and Ken Hounsel of 
Rising Star 4 - H; Revise 
Laminack and Sarah Sla ton of 
Gorman 4 - H Club; Karen 
Plowman, Nancy Cross and 
Sherry Kidd, of Eastland 4 - H 
Club. Others attending weee 
Mrs. Susan McMillan and Mrs. 
Janet Thomas, County Ex-
tension Agents. 

Daughter Of Former Residents 
Appears On Television 

Word has been received by 
this newspaper that Mrs. Jan 
Dewitt and her family of 
Albuquerque, N.M., are being 
featured in the January 
television commercial of the 
Jello Company. 

In the telecast Mrs. Dewitt 

and members of her family are 

shown demonstrating the Jello 
recipe of the month. This 
commercial is viewed at 
various times on the TV 
schedules. 

Jan is the daughter of the late 
Paul Jacobs and Mrs. Ina 

Mother Of Mrs. Glen Hubbard 
Buried In Eastland 

Jacobs of Hobbs, N.M. She is 
also a niece of Mrs. Lizzie 
Jacobs of Rising Star, Eli 
Jacobs of Big Springs, and 
Frank Jacobs of Rising Star. 

Mrs. Paul Jacobs will be 
remembered as Ina Renfro. 
She was a former teacher in the 
Rising Star Public Schools. 

REA Loan 
Approved 

Mrs. Grover N. Collins, 86, a 
lifelong Eastland County 
resident, died at 12:55 p.m. 
Thursday at Eastland 
Memorial Hospital after a brief 
illness. 

Services were held at 2:30 
p.m. Saturday in Bakker 
Funeral Home Chapel. 

Burial was in Eastland 
Cemetery. 

Born August 31, 1889, in 
Eastland County, she married 
Grover Collins March 22, 1908, 
at McGough Springs in 
Eastland County. He preceded 

producers or Secretary Butz. 
"Target prices, food reserves 

and the future of commodity 
programs stand as the major 
domestic farm policy issues," 
noted Knutson. "Farmers feel 
that in return for full produc-
tion there must be reasonable 
assurance that prices will not 
fall below production costs. 
They are opposed to reserves 
because they lower prices. 
Commodity programs such as 
those on rice and peanuts ap-
pear to be on the way out. 

"For agricultural producers 
to get a fair shake in future 
farm policies, they must make 
their voices heard - - as one 
strong body rather than as 
individual commodity groups. 
Farmers need a strong right 
hand in Washington or else they 
will have to continue catering 
to the whims of those who 
desire to use agriculture as a 
pawn," emphasized the 
economist. 

her in death. 
Survivors include two 

daughters, Merle Hubbard of 
Eastland and Mrs. Grover 
(Nell) McAnally of Kleberg; 
three brothers, Carl, Bill and 
Wayne, all of Eastland; a 
sister, Mrs. Willie Williams of 
Eastland; three half - sisters; 
two grandchildren; seven great 
- grandchildren and several 
nieces and nephews. 

Pallbearers were Bryan 
Johnson, Kenneth Johnson, Jeff 
Harbin, Elzo Harbin, Dewey 
Webb and B.W. Robertson. 

WASHINGTON, D.C. - -
Congressman Omar Burleson 
announces the approval of a 
$997,000 REA loan to the Erath 
County Electric Cooperative 
Association, with headquarters 
at Stephenville, serving Erath, 
Eastland, Palo Pinto, Stephens, 
Young, Bosque, Comanche, 
Coryell, Hamilton, Hood and 
Somervell Counties. 

The purpose of the loan is to 
finance service for 700 ad-
ditional consumers; to finance 
66 miles of distribution line; 
and to finance system im-
provements. 

overriding 	concern 	of 
producers is the question of the 
conditions under which they 
will have access to in-
ternational markets. 

"Food has become an in-
tegral part of the policy of 
detente. As such, it may be 
used either as a carrot or a 
stick in diplomacy. The carrot 
policy involves freely exporting 
to make foreign governments 
more dependent on the United 
States as a source of supply. 
The theory behind this is that a 
foreign power will not bite the 
hand that feeds it. 

"On the other hand, the stick 
policy makes access to U.S. 
grain dependent on support of 
U.S. policy by the recipient 
government. If food is used as a 
stick, the producer is in danger 
of being denied free market 
access from time to time." 

While food diplomacy 
receives a lot of attention, 
organized labor and con-
sumerism stand as even 
greater threats to producer 
access to foreign markets, 
argued Knutson. In both 1973 
and 1975, the impact of exports 
on domestic food prices was the 
primary reason for export 
controls. This reflects the fact 
that President Ford listened to 
George Meany more than to 

This bit of nocturnal photography is titled "Moonlight 
Over Charlie Ballew's Peach. Orchard" - - pretty 
isn't it? (Photo by B.A. Butler) 

COLLEGE STATION - -
Farmers are finding it in-
creasingly difficult to be heard 
in Washington. 

"Producer interests in 
agricultural policy are taking a 
secondary position to interests 
of foreign policy, consumerism 
and labor. Secretary Butz is no 
longer calling the shots on farm 
policy. Unless farmers are able 
to take charge, farm programs 
may actually be a noose around 
the producer's neck." 

That's the contention of Dr. 
Ronald Knutson, economist in 
marketing and policy for the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service, who spoke at an Ex-
tension Service Press Day 
banquet at Texas A&M 
University yesterday evening, 
January 13. 

"Producers must consolidate 
if they are to regain a position 
of control over agricultural 
policy," emphasized the Texas 
A&M University System 
economist. 

Knutson listed two critical 
policy questions on which 
producers must evaluate their 
position: (1) in whose interest 
is agricultural policy going to 
be made? (2) How much 
government involvement 
should there be? 

The economist noted that the 
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BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

DIRECTORY 

PLUMBING PROBLEMS 
Call Hutchens Plumbing 
Co. for dependable and C 
reliable service, reasonable 
rates. Water heaters also 
sold and installed. Licensed 
and Bonded. 

442.3803 
LEWIS HUTCHENS 

Rt. 2, Box 70 
Cisco, Texas 

b 

12-27)1 

	- 	  

We have qualified buyers 
for land in this area. If you 
are interested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

Jimmy Partin 

Insurance 

And Realty Co. 
3434 North 6th St. 

Office Phone 673 - 2371 

Alvin Hackfeld 692 - 9597 
Venita Raymond 692 - 5244 

• 
DON'T LET ANYONE 
TELL YOU THAT YOU 
CAN'T 
AFFORD YOUR OWN 
HOME 

Lel us show you how our 
financing plan can h"lp you 
turn the dream of a spacious 
new all brick home into a 
livml reality- ' 

Call K. B. homes Collect 
117 - 112- 3024 
\iglus. 142- 2070 

The Rising Star Jaycee 
Organization meets on • 
Thursday evening at 8:00 in 
the Scout Hut. 

Bob Clark-Pres. 
Ronnie Wilson-Sect. 

Jim Rutherford, Treas. 
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NOTICE FOR SALE FOR SALE WANTED H.V. O'BRIEN. Publisher 
MRS. GEORGE STEEL , EdIkw 

Second Class Postage paid at Rising Star, Texas, under Act of 
Congress on March, 1870. 
Published weekly - Thursdays - by Eastland County Newspapers, 
Inc. 

HAULING 
Sand, Caliche and Gravel 

R.D. Creech 
Phone 643-4236 

FOR 	SALE--IRRIGATION 
EQUIPMENT--A complete line 
of irrigation equipment. Sub-
mersible, centrifugal and tur-
bine pumps, pipe, fittings, 
volume guns and circle system. 
Let us help you with your 
irrigation needs. Machine Shop 
and pans for pump repair--test 
pit facilities. Also come take a 
look at our Herbicide Chemical 
Applicator for chemical distri-
bution through irrigation lines. 
Largest supply in Central 
Texas. 

KIMMEL IRRIGATION 
SUPPLY. INC. 
HIGHWAY 16 

DELEON, TEXAS 76444 
PHONE 817-893-6266 

TRAPPERS--HUNTERS-- 
HEADLIGHTERS 

FURS WANTED--Skinned or 
. unskinned, market prices paid, 
phone 817-725.7350, Higgin-
bottom, Corner 10th & Ave. F., 
P.O. Box 291, Cross Plains, 
Texas 76443. 8-tp 

FOR SALE - - 74 A. land, 31/2  
miles northwest of Rising Star. 
For information phone, 
daytime 817 - 643 - 3364. or at 
night 817 - 643 - 4962. 3- 3tc 

Dr. Merle M Ellis 
Optometrist 

308 Citizens Nat'l Bank 

Building 
Brownwood,itissETsexas G  

CONTACT LENSES 

or Call  646-77.

8778

Write P.O. Box 149 

ioi.va,:tobistovvvi‘ws.snir 

4.  ALFORD DRILLING CO. 
• Water wells, shallow oil 

wells, See Tommy or 0  
Curtis.2tfc  Phone 817-643-2394 

♦ 
• 5 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: In Rising Star and adjoining counties, 
$3.00 per year; in Texas, $4.00 per year; elsewhere in the U.S. and 
foreign countries, $7.00 per year 

FOR SALE - - New and used 
sewing machines. Repair on all 
makes. T.H. Kirkpatrick. (15 
years experience with the 
Singer Company). Phone 643 -
4141 for further information. 
3- tfc 

NOTICE-•I have several parties 
interested in leasing land for oil 
and gas exploration in the 
Rising Star area. If you are not 

We. 
We pay highest prices for scrap 
iron and metal. 

Call us collect for more in- 
NOTICE: Anny erroneous reflection upon the character, standing, 
or reputation of any person, firm or corporation which may appear 
in the columns of this newspaper will be gladly corrected upon 
being brought to the attention of the editor. 
All advertising orders are accepted. 

formation. Ph. 915 - 646 - 7058, k leased, please contact me for an 
Brownwood Iron and Metal Co., 	offer. Charles Rutherford, Ph. 
1500 Melwood 37 - tfc 	643-4581. 29-tfc 

HOUSE FOR SALE - - six 
rooms and bath, on 2 lots (75' x 
180') 7 pecan trees, garage, 
storm cellar and storage 
building. $7,500. Phone 643 -
3091 or 643 - 3633. 3- 2tc 

NOTICE!! 
Stanley's Critters S miles west 
67.84 of B'wood (follow signs) 
giving top prices on furs and 
live animals. Open 8 a.m. to 10 
p.m. daily. Live and steel traps. 
coon dogs for sale. Flea Market 
every Sunday. December and 
January. Ph. 915-646-1739. 
50-8te 

We arc now excepting app-
lications for L.V.N.'s at North 
view Nursing Center in East-
land. Good salary and benfits. 
Contact Mrs. Nix. 401 W. Moss. 
rs-tf 

M. L. TERRELL 
MATTRESS RENOVATE 

THE CROWN 
Soft button tufted, 
ideal for children 

1 year guarantee. $39.50 
Mfg. sug. retail price 

$69.50 
WESTERN MATTRESS 

1507 Austin Ave. 
Brownwood, Texas 

Phone 643-4141, 
Rising Star 

2-tfc 

FNAL "STILT FOR SALE--3 bedroom home. 
Living room, dining room and 
kitchen combination, bath, uti-
lity room, carport and storage 
room. Fully carpeted except 
kitchen and utility room. Ph. 
643-2452, Rising Star, 414 N. 
Main. 49-tfc 

- HIGHWAY 00 EAT 
PHONE 421-1773 :-: NIGHTS masa FOR SALE - - Truetone Black 

and White television. Console, 
in good condition. Phone 643 -
2621 or may be seen at 
Higginbothams. 4 - 2tp 

0 STENOGRAPHER WANTED--
by Equal Opportunity Employer 
Proficient in shorthand, typing, 
spelling and grammar. Court of 
Civil Appeals, 5th floor, Court-
house, Eastland, Texas. t-96 

HOUSES 
"New" 3 bedroom, 2 bath, brick home with central air and 

heat. Home has a fireplace and is in an exclusive addition of 
Eastland. 

Nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with central air and heat. Located 
on Seaman Street. $16,800.00. 

Under construction, new 3 bedroom, 2 bath, brick home. Nice 
corner lot. Well financed. 

2 bedroom, 1 bath house on 2 lots, located in Olden. $10,500.00. 
Nice 3 bedroom, 11 2  bath, home with large den, central air and 

heat, location is South Dixie. 
Nice 3 bedroom, 1 bath home, carpeted, with central heat. Good 

location. Shown by appointment only. $21,000.00 
bedroom, 3 bath house on Dixie. Shown by appointment only. 

cbedroom, 1 bath carpeted home. Good location. $18,500.00. 
2 bedroom, 2 bath home with fireplace, corner lot on Mulberry 

Street. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath home with fireplace, could be arranged for a 

duplex. 
8 city lots suited for trailer park. $6,500.00. 
6 city lots in Ranger, well located 
Store building, station, living quarters, fixtures and stock at 

Morton Valley, $8,000.00. 
3 bedroom, P4 bath, carpeted, central air and heat, corner lot, 

approximately 3 years old. 
2 bedroom house, completely carpeted and paneled, central 

heat with extra lot. $13,500.00.d 	SMALL ACREAGE 
1 acre with a 3 bedroom, 2 bath, home in Olden. 
2 tracts on Interstate20 near Cisco, lill G.I. 
26 acres near Eastland with city water $12,600.00. 
11 acres with 2 bedroom, rock home extra nice, good barns, city 

water, on pavement, North of Eastland. 
5 acres, 3 bedroom, fireplace, den and 2 bath home, Northwest 

of Cisco. $25,000.00.d 8 acres on Interstate, Ranger, Texas. Good 
location. 

Bill's Camera Repair 
Cameras - Projectors • 
Strobes - Light Meters 

4301 South 5th 
Abilene, Texas 79602 

Ph. 692 - 7418 

NOW UNDER CONSTRUC-
TION--3 bedroom, 2 bath brick 
home with central heat and air, 
2 car garage, natural wood 
burning fireplace, built-in kit-
chen appliances, large dining 
area, dressing area in master 
bedroom. Located in exclusive 
Eastland area on large wooded 
lot. Call H&W Development 
Co., 629-1702, for Gary. 48-tf 

FOR SALE--Bermuda grass 
sprigs dug daily. Phone 643-
'1137, R.L. (Bob) Rust. 2-tfc 

WANTED-immediate position 
available for relief cook, four 7 
hour shifts per week. Apply 
Twilite Acre Nursing Home, 
Rising Star, Texas. 52-tfc 

FOR SALE OR LEASE-111/2  
acres, well, improvements, 
highway 36 W. Frontage (Stan-
ley property). For information 
call A.H. Thurman, 643-6021. 
or M.D. Stanley, 915-646-1739. 
50-8tc 

r

HEARING AID 
SAL ES AND SERVICE 

Hearing Aid Sales and 
service and repair on all 
brands. John W. Clinton, 
Box 1206, Cisco, Texas. 
442- 2168. 

...............0......... 

FOR SALE--Two bedroom -
home, one bath, kitchen-dining 
room combination, carport, lot 
well located in new addition. 
512,000. Jenkins Insurance 
Agency. Phone 643-2251. 1-tfc 

White and Elna authorized 
sewing machine dealer. 
Repair all kinds, by factory 
trained mechanic. DAVIS 
FABRICS, 610 W. 2nd, 
Cisco. tfc 

WANTED - - Twilite Acres 
Nursing Home is accepting 
applications for relief LVN, 
immediate position available. 
Phone 643 - 2681. 4 - tfc Political 

Announcements 

WE CAN BUILT for you a new 3 
bedroom brick home with 
central heat and air. Low down 
payment. Monthly payments 
$65 if you qualify. For more 
information call H&W Develop-
ment Co., 629-1702, for Gary. 
48-tf 

FOR SALE 
Corded wood, 16' x 4' x 2', $40 
per cord. Will cut to specifica-
tion with one week's notice. 
Phone 442-3343. 52-tfc 

WANTED--Bermuda grass -
sprigging. Have new 4 row 
sprigger. Phone 643-3137, R.L. 
(Bob) Rust. 2-tfc 

POLITICAL CALENDAR 
The following persons have 

authorized this newspaper to 
announce their candidacy for 
political office: 

FOR SALE--2 bedroom home, 2 
acres land. Fruit trees, garden. 
Located 1 mile outside city 
limits. Ph. 643-2251. Jenkins 
Insurance Agency. 37-tfc 

DOG GROOMING 
Ph. 915-646-1739 

Nancy Stanley 
1-6 mos. 

CARD 
OF THANKS 

NOTICE--Income tax returns 
prepared, annual and quarterly 
reports, bookkeeping and no-
tary public service. Phone 725-
6156, Mrs. W.R. (Pat) Erwin. 
2-dc 

-.FOR SALE--80 acre sandy, 
/fenced tract, 3 miles of Rising 
Star, 10 acre peanut allotment, 
pecans. young fruit trees. small 
new home, good water. Phone 
643-3949. 2-4w 

CONSTABLE PRECINCT 3 
E.M. (Buddy) Turner 

N.D. Chancellor 
CARD OF THANKS 

While I was hospitalized at 
Abilene recently, my friends 
were so thoughtful and kind to 
me by sending cards, flowers, 
gifts and telephone calls, and I 
enjoyed the visits also. I must 
express to each one my deepest 
appreciation. May God bless all 
of you. 

COUNTY COMMISSIONER 
PRECINCT 3 

L.T. Owen - Re - election NOTICE!! 
Just received another 

shipment of 54" decorator -
upholstery fabrics. B - G 
Pillow Barn, 303 W. Central, 
Comanche, Texas, Ph. 915 - 356 
- 5031. 4 - 2tc 

REAL. ESTATE 
65 A. on Hwy. 36, new tank, 40 

Pecans, $375.00 per A. 
- - - 

55 A. more or less, pavement, 
8 peanuts, well fenced, some 
love grass, $375.00 per A. 

STATE SENATOR 
Tom Creighton- - re- election 4 FARMS AND RANCHES 

80 acres Southwest of Cisco, good fences, two stock tanks, and 
half minerals, with a 2 bedroom home. 

163 acres, 3 bedroom home, all coastal, good fences, and barns. 
Located in the Carbon area. $475 per acre. 

668 acres some improved grasses with a 2 bedroom house, good 
barns, good well water, located in Stephens County. 

160 acres Southeast of Ranger, deer and 1,2  minerals. $300 per 

acre. 
198 acres with 3 bedroom home on pavement with city water, 70 

acres of cultivation near Lake Leon, 
245 acres, 7 miles Southeast of Eastland with city water, 1/2  

minerals, $325 per acre. 
224 acres improved grasses with good fences and good set of 

pens. $10,000 down. Owner will finance. $315 per acre. Location 
near Carbon. 

215 acres near Olden with good fences and good stock tanks. 
491 acres in Eastland County with nice brick home, some 

coastal, fenced and crossed fenced. Approximately 1:>, the 
minerals. Shown by appointment only. 

320 acres near Carbon, 60 acres of coastal, fair fences, 1/2  

minerals. $315 per acre. 
486 acres near Lake Leon with 2 bedroom rock home, 

irrigation, and good fences, on pavement. 
695 acres in Eastland County with some river bottom, $315 per 

acre. 
306 acres near Eastland on Leon River with 106 acres coastal 

bermuda and remaining improved grasses, ample irrigation. 
Water and equipment for all of tract. 7 stock tanks, pecan trees, 4 
good fences, metal corrals and a 40 x 72' all steel barn, also other 
out buildings. 

328 acres in Stephens County. $262.50 per acre. 
320 acres with all improved grasses, good fences, 1/2  minerals, 

$350 per acre with good terms. 
160 acres with a 3 bedroom home, fireplace, 2 good tanks, 

natural gas, on pavement, city water with some love grass. 
150 acres South of Eastland, 140 acres in coastal, good fences on 

County Road with city water. $425 per a cre.d 143 acres Nor- 
thwest of Ranger, with 52 acres of peanuts, $375 per acre. 

74 acres with cultivation on County Road North of Eastland 
with city water on pavement. $400 per acre. 

120 acres on Sabanna River, pecan trees, deer and turkey, It 
minerals. Good terms. 

7 acre.  
North of Eastland with city water on pavement. $400 

per  
140 acres close to Eastland with 2 bedroom home, good barns, 

good fences, $450 per acre. 
544 acres with coastal and other improved grasses, good terms, 

some minerals. 
815 acres south of Cross Plains with deer and turkey. Ap-

proximately 1.2  minerals. 
1450 acres near Albany with approximately $500 a month oil 

income, on pavement. $210 per acre. 
150 acres north of Eastland on pavement with 77 acres of 

cultivation and city water. $400 per acre. 
1297 acres in Eastland County with some cultivation and im-

proved grasses.re
place 138acres, cpeanut allotment, 5 miles West of Rising s,lacres 

Good  

Star. 	per ar 
Putnam, 

 cr e  eAm 
 a $l  cte5s nea 	fair fences with three (3) stock tanks. 

$210 per acre. 
We have other listings large and small and all listings will be 

appreciated. 

Fast, Dependable 

Film Developing 

Palace Drug Store 

Rising Star, Texas 

SMALL HOME REPAIRS 
Reasonable rates for car-
pentry, patios, curbing, 
etc. No job too small. 
442-1370 after 6 p.m. J.B. 
Reed. 2 mos. 

Lynette Starks COUNTY SHERIFF 
Ronnie ( R.B. ) White 

John Morren CARD OF THANKS 
We are indeed grateful for 

the many kindnesses extended 
to us during the illness and 
passing of our loved one. 

The flowers, calls, cards and 
other expressions of sympathy 
made our loss easier to bear. 

We especially thank our 
neighbors and the ladies of the 
First Baptist Church for the 
delicious food that was 
provided. 

The Family of Harvey W. 
Simpson 

NOTICE - - I offer complete 
income tax service. 

Nora Tischler 
May, Texas 

Phone 259 - 2191. 
4 - 4tp 

74 A. extra nice land, part sub 
- irrigated, love grass, coastal, 
30 new land. 

Louis Hollywood 

TAX ASSESSOR - 
COLLECTOR 

Mrs. Nancy Trout 138 A. - - 1 peanuts, 35 
cultivation, good buy, only 
$235.00 A. 

Listings Appreciated 
COGBURN REALTY 
893 - 6666 or 893 - 5898 

DeLeon 

THIS GAME IS UP 
If you've ever wanted to 

have fun, a fortune or a 
better town to live in, a new 
game in town might interest 
you and teach you too. 
Designed as an academic aid, 
this game called New Town 
by Harwell Associates, plans 
a whole new town. You win 
by getting rich, the town 
wins by being well planned 
and perhaps, if people learn 
to build for beauty as well 
as profit, the whole country 
can win. Harwell is sponsor-
ing an essay competition to 
stimulate students of all ages 
to think about the type of 
community they want to 
live in in the year 2000. 
A 100 to 500 word essay 
received by April 15, 1975 

FOR RENT 

4 - tfc FOR RENT - - Small 2 room 
and bath efficiency furnished 
house. Bills paid except elec-
tricity. References and deposit 
required. Carport, nor children 
or pets. Mrs. Allene Lawson, 
Inquire at 308 S. Main. 3 - tp 

FOR SALE - - 2 bedroom 
home, carpeted, built - in 
range and oven, 2 large lots, 
barn, greenhouse and fruit 
trees. $10,500. 846 Willis, 1 block 
from NURSING HOME. Phone 
817 - 643 - 4121 after 4:00 p.m. 
weekdays. All day on 
weekends. 4 - tfc 

can receive a first prize of 
$75, a second prize of $25 
or seven other prizes of the 
New Town game, which sells 
for $10 in the home version, 
$16 for the ten-student kit 
and $28 for the 20-student 
kit. For more information 
on how you can get this 
game, write to Harwell As-
sociates, Box 95, Convent 
Station, New Jersey 0796]. 

LOST - - Liver and white 
female pointer in Romney area 
January 3. Reward. 	Bill 
Philpott, Cisco, 442 - 3234. 4 -
3tc 

4. 

FOR RENT - - 3 bedroom 
house, couple only. no children 
or pets. References with signed 
rental requirement. Conditions 
required of tenants, Allene 
Lawson, 308 S. Main. 4- 3tp 

THE FIX-IT SHOP 
TV, radio and small ap-
pliance repair. 

Fast, dependable ser• 
v ice. Free pick up and 
delivery. 

Next door to Western 
Auto Store. Phone 643-7161 
10-tfc 

INVEST A WEEKEND A MONTH 
IN A NEW CAREER. 

B & S Auto Parts 
• C B Radios & Accessories 
• Tape Decks 
• We Have A Complete Line Of 

Auto Parts And Accessories. 
• Lawn Mower .Repair And 

Service 

John W. Bishop 
Owner - Manager 

OFEREBEE. 

It's a Fun Family Thing--
Read the Want Ads. 

An Automobile Policy 
You c.to cllut %Le from man\ lob mooing courn,  orco 

to \ou IA hen Willi join a local unit. 

THE ARMY RESERVE. 
IT PAYS TO GO TO MEETINGS. 

Rising Star Optical Co. 
Eye Examinations By Appointments 

Lenses Duplicated 
Prescription Sunglasses 

Frame Repair Or Replacement. 
Large Selection Of Frames To 

Choose Front. 

Open 9:00 - 5:00 Monday Through Friday. 

Located At West Entrance Of The Rising 

Star Clinic Building 	Ph. 643-7201 

"We Appreciate You" 

Randy Wages And Willard Boyett 

2910 JULY'74 M.P. 31 

Comprehensive Coverage 
At Reasonable Rates 

Our policies don't leave 
thing to chance . . . you can 
lean back and enjoy auto 

ownership without a 
in the world! 

Campbells 
Colin try Store 

a 
Prices Good Feb. 1 To Feb. 7 

Only While Supplies Last 

49c Pound Block Oleo--.35 
56` Lesieur Peas - .44 

Super Value, Bread, 24 oz. Loaf --.39 

5 lb. Pure Cane Sugar--.79 

$5.00 Purchase 

Phone 259-2323 May, Texas 76857 

worry WE HAVE OTHER LISTINGS 
LARGE AND SMALL 

ALL LISTINGS WILL BE APPRECIATED 

RODGER TERRELL 
Home Phone 629 - 2896 

M.L. TERRELL 
Home Phone 629 - 2443 
Eastland. Texas 

a 

Free Estimate 

Jenkins 
Insurance Agency 

Phone 817-643-2251 
Rising Star, Texas 

OFFICE PHONE 629 - 1725 
HIWAY 80 EAST 
EASTLAND. TEXAS 



	_ a Thursday, January 22, 1976 
****************************************************************** Announcing Consumer 

Food News "Yesterday" 
COLLEGE STATION - - 

Fryer chickens and grapefruit 
take the "bargain spotlight" in 
many grocery stores across 
Texas this week, Mrs. Gwen-
dolyne Clyatt, a consumer 
marketing information 
specialist, reports. 

Fryer features include whole 
birds - - as well as parts, she 
added. 

Mrs. Clyatt is with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice, the Texas A&M 
University System. 

Of the grapefruit supply, she 
said its quality is "excellent", 
while its lower prices are due to 
the large crop. 

Other economical fruit buys 
include oranges, tangerines, 
tangelos, and pears. Banana 
prices are a bit lower, but apple 
prices vary with variety and 
size of fruit. 

At vegetable counters, sweet 
potato and broccoli prices are 
lower - - with the same 
prediction for cabbage and 
carrots in upcoming weeks. 

"Consumers shouldn't 
overlook rutabagas as a 
delicate - flavored vegetable 
dish, either - - both supply and 
quality are excellent," Mrs. 
Clyatt added. 

"Vegetables in the moderate 
- price range are Brussels 
sprouts, cauliflower, beets and 
eggplant." 

In meat sections, beef prices 
are stable, and good values 
appear on chuck cuts, ground 
beef, some steaks for broiling, 
chunk bologna and liver. 

"Pork prices show no 
significant change, but best 
values are Boston butt and 
quarter - loin cut into chops. 
Smoked cuts at lower prices 
include picnics and roll 
sausage. 

In the egg department, prices 
vary - - with a few instances of 
price decline. 

In the egg department, prices 
vary - - with a few instances of 
price decline. Generally, large 
- size eggs are the best value. 

CONSUMER WATCH 
WORDS: Dairy features this 
week include a variety of 
cheese, low - fat milk, sour 
cream and yogurt. 

Church of Christ First Baptist 
Church 

"Try it. You'll like it.;' So 
went the advertising slogan 
some time ago. A word of 
caution must be given as 
illustrated by the story 
Spurgeon used to tell. 

"An American gentleman 
said to a friend, 'I wish you 
would come down to my gar-
den, and taste my apples.' He 
asked him about a dozen times, 
but the friend did not come; 
and at last the fruit - grower 
said, 'I suppose you think my 
apples are good for nothing, so 
you won't come and try them.' 
'Well, to tell you the truth', said 
his friend, 'I have tasted them. 
As I went along the road I 
picked one up that fell over the 
wall, and I never tasted 
anything so sour in all my life; I 
do not particularly wish to have 
any more of your fruit.' Oh,' 
said the owner of the garden, 'I 
thought it must be so. Those 
apples around the outside are 
for the special benefit of the 
boys. I went fifty miles to select 
the sourest sorts to plant all 
around the orchard, so the boys 
might give them up as not 
worth stealing; but if you will 
come inside, you will find that 
we grow very different quality 
there, sweet as honey.' Those 
who judge the church by its 
worst members ( the hangers -
on around the edge) - - those 
most like the world, make the 
same mistake." 

Are you making the same 
mistake? Come to the inside 
fellowship of God's people and 
"taste and see that the Lord is 
Good." 

Why not be in church this 
Sunday! 

Visiting last Sunday morning 
was Jonni Hubbard of Rising 
Star. 

The pastor is speaking at the 
Sunday Morning hour on God's 
messages to the seven churches 
of Revelation. This coming 
Sunday, "THE Church at 
Perga mum." 

Sunday evening service is at 
7:00. 

R.D. Williams, Pastor 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Stepp of 
Detroit, Michigan are an-
nouncing the birth of their first 
child, Andrew Wayne, born on 
December 31. 1975, and 
weighing 6 lbs., and 4 ozs. 

Mr. and Mrs. G.C. Stewart of 
Rising Star are the great -
grandparents. G.C. thinks he 
deserves a cane. Maybe 
someone will take the hint and 
present him with one. 

(We feel the following article, 
entitled: 	NO 	MORE 
HYPOCRITES, by John Gib-
son, to be worth sharing). 

I dare you to show me a hy-
ocrite. You can't do it. In just 
one generation we have wit-
nessed the death of hypocrisy. 
It has been wiped out. And 
much of the credit goes to the 
young people. They have seen it 
in their parents, they have 
detected it in business and have 
scorned it in government. Their 
plea has been, "Tell it like it is" 
and hypocrisy has been slain in 

• the streets. 
But somehow I find it more 

natural to weep at the funeral 
than to rejoice. I know that 
hypocrisy is evil. Jesus was 

• constantly denouncing it. In 
fact, some of the most scathing 
language of our Lord ever 
uttered was directed to the 
hypocrites of his day. 

As a people we have revolted 
against hypocrisy. That's well 
and good. But in making the 180 
degree turn, we have sped past 
righteousness into the ditch of 
open sin. Hypocrisy has been 
said to be the homage that vice 
pays to virtue. Where there is 
none, where vice has ceased to 
shroud or veil itself, a very 
advanced stage of wickedness 
has been reached. 

Try as I may, I find no con-
solation in the death of 
hypocrisy in our society. 
Women confess their abortions 
and urge their friends to have 
one. Homosexuals openly 
parade their sins on television 
talk shows. Young people 
blatantly live in adultery. 
Profanity has stalked out of the 
locker room to invade every 
area of a blushless society. 
Pornography is openly 
available to children. And we 
sit around and congratulate 

(ourselves on not being 
hypocrites. Listen to the words 
of an ancient prophet of Israel:,  
"They proclaim their sin like 
Sodom, they do not hide it. Woe 

cto them! For they have brought 
evil upon themselves." (Isaiah 
3:9). 

It is hard not to long for the 
good old days - - the days when 
you could find a hypocrite. (end 
of quote). 

In the Scriptures, God tells us 
how to overcome both the ef-
fects and the practice of sin. 
Make it a habit to attend Bible 
classes and meetings where 
God's Word is respected and 
taught. Join us for Bible study 
on Sunday at 9:30, on Wed-
nesday at 7 p.m. and in the 
assemblies on Sunday at 10:30 
a.m. and 6 p.m. 

Many have been sick with the 
flu and other respiratory 
ailments, but most are im-
proving. Pate Goss is still in 
Brownwood Hospital - - Room 
524. Bill Lee was scheduled for 

-*surgery on Monday for back 
problems. Vina White's 
daughter - in - law (Paul's 
wife) is undergoing treatment 
in an Odessa hospital. Elmo 
Mauldin was in the Stephenville 
Hospital several days for ob-
servation. Inez Robertson 
continues to improve. Alice 
Harris is up and around some 
now. Buck Maples seems a 
little better, but still has a lot of 
pain. Clifford Hale has had 
several days of severe 
breathing difficulty lately. Mrs. 
Dell King's sister (Mrs. Ruth 
Bowen) was to undergo serious 
surgery in Fort Worth Monday. 

A good group of young people 
from Rising Star and Abilene 
enjoyed an afternoon of activity 
and devotions last Sunday. 
Several of the young men 
conducted the evening 
Assembly, including the ser-
mon. Jim Dickson and Robert 
Schulman - - Bible majors 
from Abilene Christian College, 
will be working each week with 
our young people. All young 
people: from Grade Four up, 
are invited to come and par-
ticipate in this. 

May your week be a good one. 
Call us if we can serve you in 

(any way, especially to talk with 
you about Gospel matters. 

- - - Owen Aikin 

Sipe Springs 

BY MRS. JACK MILLW'EF. 

3,•‘ 	 •.• 	- 

The J.J. Montgomery family in 1903 or 1904. Shown left to right: Mr. Montgomery, Alta Montgomery 
Briscoe, Mrs. Montgomery, Lizzie Montgomery Nunnally, Allene Montgomery Fowler, Vera 
Mon-tgomery Joyce, Hassie Montgomery Moon. 
*****************************************************************411 

Several from Sipe Springs 
attended the funeral services 
for George Reeves at 
Comanche the 9th of January. 

Visitors in the N.L. Leonard 
home have been Mrs. Mary 
Harper of Dallas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Leonard and kids of 
Fort Worth, Mrs. Willie Mae S 
Stokes of Sheffield, Mrs. Jo Nell 
Leonard and George Leonard 
of Gorman. 

- - - 
Dennis Price of Arlington and 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Helmuth 
and boys of Gorman visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Jeff Price. 

drive 

Mr. and Mrs. Reecie Jones of 
Stephenville and C.P. Auten of 
Whitney visited Mrs. Ruby 
Boswell. 

I 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman An-

derson, Zelma Morgan and 
Ruby Boswell attended Maggie 
Smith's birthday Sunday at 
Rising Star. REDDY'S 

REFRIGERATOR 
SAVINGS TIPS 

Telisha Joyce and Tommy 
Brisco of East Texas State 
University spent the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Moe Rainer. 

Contributions to the Rising 
Star Cemetery Fund: 

_PERMANENT FUND 
Howard Barnes, Ft. Worth -

- $20 
Mrs. Walter West, McKin-

ney, memorial to Plotte Roach 
- - $10 

Lillian Burton, Rising Star -
- $10 

Warren Bailey, Rising Star -
- $5 

1975 
MEDICARE FACTS 

Hospital Charges 
You Pay — 
• The first $92 
• $23 a day for the 61st 

through the 90th day 
• $46 a day for each 

"lifetime reserve" day 

Skilled Nursing 
Facility Charges 

You Pay — 
• $11.50 a day for the 

21st through the 100th 
day 

th 

INFLATION—RISING PRICES—HIGHER COSTS—INFLATION 

OUR FAMOUS JANUARY SPECIAL 
NOW le HIGHER . . . 

Recover your old innerspring 

$19.76 
ANNIVERSARY 

RENOVATE & SAVE! 

THE PRICES YOU PAY ONLY WHEN YOU BUY DIRECT FROM 

Never Again 

at this 

LOW price-lc Higher 
Next Year! 

A FACTORY OR SLEEP SHOP! 

White Sewing Machine Company is 
celebrating its 100th year, with 
a Giant Trade•In Sale! 

Your old sewing machine 
is worth S100 regardless of 
make, model or condition. 

That's right - we'll give 
you S100 for your old 
sewing machine, toward 
the purchase of a . new 
White Sewing Machine. 

The Supreme 
Orthopedic engineered but-
ton tutted inner bed Limn 
quilted smooth top 	I Plum 

guarantee 
Mai Sp' Retail 119.00 

'64" There never was a better time to buy. And remember, 
White has been famous for quality and integrity, since 
1876. 

USE OUR 

"PAY•AS. 
YOU-SlEEP" 

PLAN 

MI NW ICUS 
Runty 

•c 
"TRU-QILT" Luxury Quilted Top—Extra Firm 

MATTRESS and BOX SPRING SETS 
Built-In Stitch Selector 
Stretch Stitches 
Zig lag Stitches 
Straight Stitch 
Built-In Buttonholer 
Built-In Blind Hemmer 
Diamond Point Feed 
Adjustable Pressure 

Pick up your FREE copy of 

"ENERGY CONSERVATION" 

Booklet from 

a • Wigidaire 
Home Environment Division of General Motors. 

Double Slz• 	Ovnn Size 	King Si,. 
oo ve,VI 	 11100 VALVI 	 379.  00 YAW. 

139.00 199.00, i 	249.00 
1507 Austin Ave. 
Brownwood, Texas 
In Rising Star 
Call 643-4141 
11181T OUR IREEl SHOPS 

I S•Iew 
Ovetenre• WestTexas Utilities 

Company A.n Cowl 
Oroortfatie Enzi1deer 

Davis Fabrics Remember REMY Supplies the energy—

but only YOU can use it wisely! 

Ovr cornplol• both-own Horn wit lontati 
en Ableas • e,p $pr ,np • De ow. mood • 

OW Rio • 14.04nd • Orlon •I 
nu el rn Son Ang• ,o 

Au PIECES WITHOUT 
TRADE IN '10 ADDITIONAL 

western 
	 firlattron 

610 W. 2nd Cisco 
"We Service All Makes, Most Models" 

Offering The Lastest Styles 

For Men And Women 

The Hair Place 
* 448 MAIN STREET * 

(BEHIND THE DAIRY QUEEN) 

Specializing In Layer Cuts 

Open Tuesday Thru Saturday 

725-6301 
,0-01-104/ 

7. 76-191) 

Don't open refrigerator door unnecessarily. 

Plan your trips to the refrigerator while cook-

ing. Make sure the children maintain a 

closed-door policy. 

Buy the size that fits your needs. An over-

large refrigerator or freezer wastes space as 

well as electricity. 

4' Clean external coils, fins and motor often 

and keep them free from dust. 

Defrost your refrigerator and freezer before 
ice deposit exceeds 1/4 inch. Excess ice 
causes your refrigerator to work' harder. 

n 

The Crown 
Medium him button tubed 
Mal In chittren I-yen 

gurantet 

The Capri 
Film button lulled inner bed 
and smooth too Ideal la 
cunt MOM Site/ guarantee 

MIg Sug Retail 69.00 

The Sleepy 
Medium turn button tufted. 

durable Coat and Quilted 
Doling Built Ice Kira of 
tomfeet 5-year guarantee 

lelg Sul Retail 69 00 Mfg Sul Retail 59 00 

• 41111****************41  

FREE 
Come In, Get Acquainted, And 

Register For Free 
$25°° Permanent Wave. 

Connie's Beauty Salon 
Phone: 6434673 

Formerly Robin's Beauty Shop 
Operators 

Debbie Linney And Susie Bailey 



CITRUS STUM PERS 
How much do you know about the food you eat? Just for fun, 

test yourself on this quiz and see. It's all about grapefruit. 
1. Grapefruit originated in a. Asia b. South America c. West 
Indies 
2. The introduction of grapefruit to the United States is 
attributed to a. Christopher Columbus b. Ponce de Leon c. 
Count Philippe of France 
3. The United States produces what percentage of the world's 
supply of grapefruit? a. 75% b. 54% c. 27% 
4. Most production is from a. Florida b. Louisiana c. California 

5. One-half medium grapefruit a. 72 calories b. 90 calories c. 
110 calories 
6. A tangelo is a cross between a. tangerine and lemon b. 
tangerine and grapefruit c. tangerine and orange 
7. The hotter the climate, the yellower the grapefruit. True or 
False? 
Answers: 1. a. 2. c. 3. a. 4. a. 5. a. 6. b. 7. False. 	In fact, 
in very tropical areas. grapefruit usually remain green or contain 
patches of green, even when mature. 

'MOD WI TER 
CA  R  NI1 

OF MECO LS 
This Mammoth Sale Begins January 29. 

Watch For Circulars In The Mail. 

Palace Drug Store 
Rising Star, Texas 	Phone 643-3231 

\ ce` 

Wildcat Tales 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Edge of 
Greenville, South Carolina, 
visited her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack White and other 
relatives last week. 

Sponsor 	 Mrs. Linda Burns 
Editor 	 Peggy Perr 

.,Ass't. Editor 	 Susan Walke 

r. Reporter - Ready For Everything 	Susan Welke 
r. Reporter - Today, Not Tomorrow 	Tricia Jone 
oph. Reporter - In Search of the Future.... _ .Jenny Walke 

Freshman Reporter - In the Fishbowl   	Kim Harri 
FA Reporter -With the Farmhands.... ..Doddie Chambe • 
HA 	Reporter -Toward New Horizons. .Randie Bradle 
nnual Staff Reporter - A Yearbook Never Forgets 	Pam Hil 

Cheerleader Reporter--All the Way Big Blue. .Kathy Wilson 
Boys Sports -Wildcat Country 	  .Ken Hounsel 
Girls Sports -LC's Goldfingers 	 KCD Rutherfor 
Band Reporter -Do Re Mi 	 Nancy Medfor 
Library Reporter -With the Bookworms 	Beth Wallace 
Reporter - at - large -Galloping Gossip 	Clark Smit 

Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. M.J. Dukes last week 
were Mr. and Mrs. A.F. Stark 
of Crosbyton and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Graham of Sipe Springs. 

Dr. James Loftin of 
Galveston was a weekend guest 
in the home of his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Loflin, Mr. and 
Mrs. Buck Christian and Mr. 
and Mrs. Milton Green. He also 
visited Mrs. E.I. Christian at 
the nursing home while here. 

TARC Gets Second Grant 

	

Mrs. Ferris Clements of 
	

ilitative services. 

	

Brownwood, Chairman of the 
	

Mrs. Clements further sta- 

	

Texas Advisory Council for 
	

ted, "Because of this project, 

	

Developmental Disabilities has 
	problems in rural service 

announced that the Texas delivery systems have been 

	

Association for Retarded Citi- 
	

identified, which is the first step 
zens (TARC) has been awarded to solving the problem of 

	

second year continuation for the 
	available help in rural areas." 

	

TARC -Information and Refer- 
	

"Too often parents and rela- 

	

ral Developmental Disabilities 
	

tives of developmentally dis- 

	

grant project for an 18-county 	abled persons have few or no 
area of Central Texas. 	 place to turn for help, but with 

	

The project will continue an 
	

the TARC Information and 

	

Information and Referral ser- 
	

Referral Office, service pro- 

	

vice for persons who are 
	viders can more readily be 

	

mentally retarded, cerebral 
	

brought to bare on the situation 

	

palsied, epileptic, or multi-han- 	and monitored to be sure 

	

dicapped as well as working 
	services are actually being 

	

with supportive volunteer or- 	provided." 

	

ganizations in each county 
	

Those counties included are 
wishing to help. 	 Bosque, Brown, Burnet, Calla- 

	

"This pilot project is the only 
	

han. Coleman, Comanche, Cor- 

	

one of its kind in Texas with its 
	

yell. Eastland. Erath. Hamilton, 

	

office located in Brownwood." 
	

Hill. Lampasas, Llano. Mason, 

	

said Mrs. Clements. "TARC's 
	

Mills, McCulloch, San Saba. 

	

first year efforts have had a 
	

and Stephens Counties. 

	

tremendous impact on the lives 
	

Any organization wanting to 

	

of developmentally disabled 
	

help in their county or anyone 

	

persons in central Texas." 
	

needing help or services for a 

	

Through the Information and 
	

developmentally disabled per- 

	

Referral Office, requests for 	son should contact the TARC- 

	

assistance are referred to area 
	

Information and Referral Office, 

	

agencies and service providers 
	

318 Citizens National Bank 

	

who have the responsibility for 
	

Bldg., Brownwood. Texas. - 

	

providing education and rehab- 
	

76801, or call AC 915.643-1432. 

Guest Named Speaker 

Mrs. Frank Gray and Mrs. 
James Wolf underwent surgery 
last week in Cisco HospitaL 
They are both doing 
satisfactorily. 

- - - 
Mrs. Pete Starks has 

returned home after an ex-
tended hospital stay in Hen-
drick Hospital in Abilene. She 
says she is feeling fair, but 
could feel better. 

The Sophomore class got 
their playbooks. 	We will 
present a play in the near 
future. The girls are 2-1 in 
districi play. The boys play 
Monday and Thursday. This 
week went by fairly slow. The 
Civics class put on a trial last 
week and it was really interest-
ing. They selected a jury and 
everything. Everyone enjoyed 
it. 
We really have been getting 

the homework. I hope they lay 
off for awhile. 

Smile, 

Jenny 

Mrs. Weldon Roach and Mrs. 
Jack Arledge spent the 
weekend in Seminole where 
they visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmy Roach. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Mery Ova and 

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Ova of 
Pingree, North Dakota, were 
visitors in the home of Rev. and 
Mrs. R.D. Williams. Mrs. Mery 
Ova is a sister of Mrs. 
Williams. 

Mrs. Carl Stroebel is a 
patient at Cisco Hospital. 

- - - 	 • 
Mrs. Jim Christian is 

hospitalized in Eastland 
Memorial Hospital. 

- - - 
Mrs. Tony Thomas of.  

Midland has been a visitor in 
the home of her mother, Mrs. 
Myrtle Tyler. For Democratic Workshop 

IN THE FISH BOWL 

to 

I am proud to announce that I 
am now handling STARKEY 
hearing aids. STARKEY 
guarantees satisfaction with 
the use of its Custom Ear and 
provides one of the most 
complete warranties available. 

Cl 

aned the wood part of a chair. 
Mrs. Opal Fleming and Mrs. 

Grace Glenn made several visits 
with friends in Rising Star last 
week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Bruton 
had Mrs. Glenn and Mrs. 
Fleming as guests for 42 games 
recently. 
The infant son of Mr. and Mrs. 

Chuck Mason was entered into 
the Brownwood Community 

Hospital on Jan. 19 because of 
double pneumonia. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Altum 
visited the Auto show at the 
Civic Center in Abilene last 
week. Cars dating from 1929 to 
1950 were on exhibit. 

The May 4-H Club presented 
the program for the Community 
Improvement Club at their 
Monday night meeting. Jan. 12, 
1976. Each member present 
told how they participated in the 
Brown County Youth Fair. 
Displays of foods and crafts 
were shown. Ribbons were also 
displayed. Kenny Hignight 
showed his rossette for High 
Point in the Junior Crafts 
Division and his trophy for 
Junior Reserve Champion in the 
Homemaking Division. Mem-
bers attending were: Yvonne 
Petross, Shelton McCallie, Lyn-
ne Whiteaker. Kenny Hignight, 
Becky Moore, Matt Muckleroy, 
Becky Windham, Bobby Bur-
nett and Janet Nelson. Leaders 
present were Mrs. S.M. Moore 
and Mrs. Wayne Nelson. 

Reporter, Janet Nelson 

Dear Sis, 
We had some S degree 

weather last week and without 
gas most of 2 days. 

Mr. R.T. Copeland will enter 
Henricks Memorial Hospital in 
Abilene on Jan. 21 for major 
surgery on Jan. 23. 

Mr. and Mrs. Terry Moore 
and Tanya of Waco visited his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Gib 
Moore in May and her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Chambers 
of Rising Star. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Nelson, 
Janet, and Kenny attended the 
funeral of Mrs. Nelsons grand-
mother. Mrs. Florence Fain 
Read in Augusta, Texas last 
week. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Wagner 
of Hereford visited Mrs. Grace 
Glenn on Thursday of last week 
while Mr. and Mrs. Windle 
Glenn of Lake Jackson were 
visiting in the home of Mrs. 
Grace Glenn. 

The May Home Demonstra-
tion Club met on Jan. 14. at 10 
a.ni. for an all day meeting. 
highlighted by a salad lunch-
eon. The morning session was a 
demonstration of sand painting 
by Mrs. Connie Edmondson of 
Comanche. The evening sesion 
was a brief business meeting 
and the afternoon program was 
given by the County agent, 
Mrs. Carolyn Gilbert on remod-
eling out-dated furniture. 
Slides were shown of various 
furniture styles and a "do it 
yourself" demonstration was 
given when Mrs. Gilbert cle- 

C) I I 4 

7-4 

See The 

Starkey Custom Ear 

At 

Clinton Hearing Aid Service 

F.  

It hurts me to say that we have 
a murderer loose in the school. 
Not actually a real murderer, 
but the victim of the Civics class 
trial. Danny Mungia was 
acquitted of the murder charge; 
but if he didn't kill his fictional 
wife, who did? Was it the maid 
or Danny's business partner or 
the zealous wife? The world 
may never know, but in the 
meantime I'm not going to turn 
my back while a Senior is in the 
room. 

Senatorial District No. 22 has 
been combined with Senatorial 
District No. 24 and No. 30 to 
form this region. Members of 
our district serving on the 
Regional Affirmative Action 
Steering Committee are: Jerry 
Craft, 	Jacksboro; 	Joe 
Guerrero, Breckenridge; 
Gerald Cumpton, Olney; Terry 
Moellinger, Denton; Wanda 
Britton, Gainesville; Doris 
Maxwell, Comanche; and 
Sarah Tackett, Alvarado. 

Kim 

State Democratic Executive 
Committee Chairman, Calvin 
Guest, of Bryan, Texas, will be 
the guest luncheon speaker at a 
Regional Affirmative Action 
Workshop to be held January 
24, 1976, from 10:00 a.m. to 3:00 
p.m. in Graham, Texas, at the 
American Legion Hall. 
Registration will begin at 9:00 
a.m. There will be no cost for 
this workshop other than $3.25 
per person to pay for his own 
lunch. 

This is the first program of 
this type in the history of the 
Democratic Party of Texas. 
This program has been 
designed to encourage par-
ticipation by grass roots 
Democrats and to train them in 
:he basic political techniques. 
Ne encourage ALL Democrats 
o attend. Mr. R.C. Slagle HI of 
;herman, Texas, and Mr. 
lames Allison, of Cooper, 
'exas, will lead the workshop. 
'he workshop will be divided 
nto the following four areas of 
nterest: 
1. Voter Registration (New 

aaw) 
2. Precinct Organization 
3. Precinct, County and State 

7onvention Procedures and the 
tew Presidential Primary. 
4. Volunteers and Standing 

)rganizations (How to organize 
nd keep interest). 

Cisco 	442-2168 114 W. 8th 

Indians believed that the world rests on the head of an 
elephant, whose movements cause earthquakes! 

THOUGHTS IN PASSING 

Whew! We had just struggled 
through a harrowing first half of 
our Senior year. Naturally we 
thought the second half would 
be smooth sailing. After all, 
isn't the first part the hardest? 

So we arrived at school 
January 6th. Mrs. B. blitzed us 
as soon as we sat down in 
English. The play is Friday, she 
announced. No arguments 
would sway her. This time she 
got her way. We had four days 
to get a three-act play together 
and by golly, we did it. Not too 
badly, either. 

Then we got into Civics. The 
trial is next Thursday, he 
announces. We were ready for 
that one. What we weren't 
prepared for was how securely 
almost twenty seniors had kept 
a secret for so long without even 
breathing a word to even 
another senior. 
We got that one over pretty 

well, too. Now we have term 
themes to look forward to, two 
volleyball tournements, and 
lord knows what else. Oh, yes, I 
do know one other thing. 
Where to go for a senior trip. 
Maybe all we are struggling 
through right now will have 
prepared us for that conflict. 

Optimistically. 

Mahal 

ROVER REPORTS 

Dear Ms. Editor: 
Madame, tis my distinct honor 

to submit to your ready eyes 
this sweet bit of news from 
about our cheery institution. 

DATELINE--Senior class 
presents the much heralded 
murder trial of Mr. Danny 
Niungia. Testimony came from 
all the members of the Civics 
class. Witnesses were subject-
ed to the grueling questioning 
from •the two cracker-jack 
(literally) lawyers-Marilyn Clark 
and Clark Smith. The clash of 
the Clarks. you might say, with 
M.C. defending the culprit and 
C.S. seeking to illuminate his' 
wrongs. The case was 
presented before a jury consist-
ing of twelve students from the 
junior and sophomore classes. 
Although they gave it their best 
effort, they still found the 
accused innocent. The Honor-
able Peggy Mahal Pegral Perry 
presided over the proceedings. 
All the student body seemed to 
enjoy the trial, even though it 
was supposed to be a learning 
experience. On behalf of the 
Civics class, we all thank Mr. 
Fortune for the kind of teacher 
that encourages us to "learn by 
doing." 

But enough about the trial. 
matter of fact enough about 
news 	 

Recessed 

Anthony J. Grundy 

READY FOR EVERYTHING 

In case anyone missed our play, 
we just wanted you to know we 
may put it on again later on and 
hope you will be able to attend. 
Tommy Hill is in the hospital 
this week for knee surgery and 
would appreciate any visitors. 
We are now making plans for a 

volleyball tournement like the 
one we sponsored last year and 
are sending out invitations. We 
have already received four 
entries. The tournement is Feb. 
26. 27, and 28. If you are 
interested in entering a team 
please contact one of the 
seniors. 

Till next week, 

Susan 

A YEARBOOK 

NEVER FORGETS 
Pasii-43  

The annual is coming along 
fine. Everyone is working hard 
to meet their deadlines. The 
annual staff has been invited to 
tour a publishing company, but 
nothing has been decided on 
what we will do. 
There has been a lot going on 

here lately-basketball, plays. 
trials, and all sorts of things. 
However, we are still trying our 
best to give our share to the 
annual. 

Have a nice day! 
Pam 

ON THE FARM 

The VoAg I boys arc studying 
all about poultry. The different 
grades and qualities of poulltry 
and eggs are some of the topics 
they are studying. 

The VoAg II boys arc learning 
how to judge livestock are 
muscular quarters, clean bris-
kets, and clean underlines. 

The VoAg III class is studying 
all about tractor maintenance. 

With Love, 
Fall Knit Material Reduced 

To 

$2" & $298 

Doddie 

o‘  
-41Iea. 	-411111! 00. 

1 Group 45" Fabrics 

2 For The Price Of ONE ....... es 

LC'S GOLDFINGERS 
Bet you thought I 'was 

never going to write the news 
again-well, folks, just give me 
time! We are now in District 
play. At this time we stand 2-1. 
Pretty good. huh? Looks like we 
will have to battle Moran for 
District this year. Their guards 
arc quick but fortunately they 
only have a one-man or rather 
woman offense that 	sure we 
can beat. Our next game is 
Thursday-here with Moran. 
Friday and Saturday we will 
host a "B" team tourney. 
Other teams in this tournament 
are Gorman. Early, and Cross 
Plains. 

Rita's Fashion 
Fabrics -40getatt, MfalO\I  

agarafrj  War t‘ 

See ya at the games. 

KC 
1-20 East Next To Ramada Inn 

629-8020 

EHRMPI n 
MODULAR HOME 

Today, not tomorrow 

28 BEAUTIFUL FEET WIDE FIRST STATE 
BANK 

The new year finds the Juniors 
back to work. We have an 
English term duo the 20th of 
this month. It has to be typcd, 
so if you hear someone pecking 
along you'll know what they are 
doing. Class is beginning to get 
back to normal. It isn't long 
now until the end of the second 
quarter. It's hard to believe the 
year is half over. 

That's All, I 
• • 

Tricia 

Texas-  Largest Dealer is proud to introduce 

the CHAMPION modular home by the nations.' 

largest builder. Champion Homes. 
The CHAMPION has over 1550 sq ft. of 

pure Jiving space. 3 huge bedrooms, den and 

bath and 3/4 . 

FLAMEPROOF DRYWALL interior pannel-
ling and ceilings throughout and lots of carpet. 

The best part is that you can have the 
CHAMPION installed on your lot for under $140 

a month on an FHA loan. 

Member F.D.I.C. 

Rising Star, Texas 
IN SEARCH OF THE FUTURE UNDER $140.00 A MO. 1550 SQ. FT. 

Abilene Mobile Homes 
4618 N. 1st 	 672-6466 

PARKING • DRIVE-IN BANKING 

EXCELLENCE IN BANKING 
ran igar- 

Last week we lost a true 
friend "'llama" Catherine Bis-
bee. We will really miss you. 
She is moving to Clyde. Good 
LuckI  

veRifcr`r-; 

May News 
Entha Campbell 

Thursday, January 22, 1976 
Ire ant MJ 

► COMMUNITY NEWS  
4 

0 
hJ 

Get off the high cost of auto, truck or farm equipment 

financing and see --_FIRST STATE BANK 	 
about low interest financing. You'll be riding high when you 

Jo business with us. 

1' 

"Olt.rararbranime.  
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T.-Bone Steak 3.25 
Charbroiled to Your Taste, Chilled Salad 

Choice of Potatoes and Texas Toast 

PITT 
GRILL 7. 

Chopped Sirloin 2.00 
From Select Sirloin Cuts with 

Choice of Potatoes, Chilled Salad with 
Your Choice of Dressing 

and Texas Toast 

Rib Eye Steak 323 
Tender and Juicy, Potatoes, 

Chilled Salad and Texas Toast 

Filet Mignon 3.00 
Tender and Juicy, Broiled to Your Taste, 

Choice of Potatoes and 
Chilled Salad with Choice, 

of Dressing 

Pried Shrimp 2.50 
Tartar Sauce, Salad, Choice of Potatoes 

and Texas Toast 

1-20 HIGHWAY 
CISCO 	(East Exit) 

OPEN 24 HOURS 

Pith Plate 1.65 
Tartar Sauce, Chilled Salad, 

Choice of Potatoes end Texas Toast 

Chicken Pried Steak 1.90 
French Fried Potatoes, Salad, 

and Texas Toast 

Ham Steak 2.50 
Center Cut, Chilled Salad, Choice of 

Potatoes and Texas Toast 

SERVING YOUR 

FAVORITE BREAKFAST 

ANYTIME- 

DAY OR NIGHT 

ENJOY THESE AND THE OTHER FINE FOODS AT OUR CLEAN 
AND FRIENDLY PLACE 

Thursday, January 22, 1976 

Kincaid's 
Real Estate Corner 

Birthday 

Greetings 
HOUSES 

3 bedroom frame home, living room, dining room, kitchen, 
utility area with washer, dryer, bath, newly panelled throughout, 
single car garage and storage, corner lot, offered completely 
furnished, new Spanish style living room suite with hide - abed, 
color TV, dining room furniture, Spanish style bedroom suite, one 
brass bed and chest, one set twin beds, stove, refrigerator and 
other misc. items, all included at the price of $11,200.00. 

Large 3 bedroom frame, large living and dining room com-
bination, bath, garage, pecan trees, garden spot, large lot, 
located 115 Scurry St., Gorman. $10,500.00. Consider Terms. 

LAKE PROPERTY 

Betty Ann Kizer  And David Griffin 
Vows Exchange Wedding 

JANUARY 21 
Mrs. G.H. Lockhart 
David Watson 
Darryl Watson 
Mabel Dill 

JANUARY 22 
Otis Lee 
Rowena Chambers 
Jeffrey Butler 

JANUARY 23 
Judy Butler 
Nancy McDaniel 
John David Childers 

JANUARY 24 
Linda Burns 
Laura Lipps 
Lon McDaniel 
Edith Carlile 

JANUARY 25 
Lessie Smith 

JANUARY 26 
Joe Dell Hubbard 
Michele Hayhurst 
Willie Hughes 
Aline Morris 
Vicki Lunceford 

JANUARY 27 
O.J. Crownover 

Local Couple Observes 
Golden Anniversary 

Mr. and Mrs. George NI. Hill 
were honored on January 10, 
with a dinner party in 
celebration of their 50th 
wedding anniversary. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Wright 
were hosts for the occasion 
which was attended by 
relatives and close friends of 
the honorees.. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hill were 
married January 9. 1926, in San 
Anvelo by the Reverend 

McCall, then pastor of the First 
Baptist Church of San Angelo. 

The Hills have two 
daughters, 	Mrs. 	W.E. 
Alexander of Glendora, 
Claifornia, and Mrs. Charles 
Wright of Rising Star. 

Mrs. Hill (Pauline) was the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
George M. Smith of San Angelo. 
Mr. Hill is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter W. Hill of Rising 
Star. 

Grade School Names 28 
To Honor Roll 

6CCORVING TO T1iE sunisrss 
600K OF WORLV RECow251  17H • 

'NOW'?" CLARKE OF SUFrOLK, 
ENGLAND, HOLDS THE RECORD 
For/ -THE ogEATE5T NUMBER OF 
PAID JOSS IM A WORKING LIFE, 

Hot 

Betty Ann Kizer became the 
bride of David Andrew Griffin 
on Tuesday evening, January 6, 
in the home of the bride's 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
E.O. Kizer. 

The Reverend Hubert Taylor 
officiated the double ring 
ceremony. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. R.E. Kizer of 
Rising Star. 

Parents of the bridegroom 

is 
are Lt. Col. (U.S.A.F. Ret. ) and 
Mrs. Andrew Griffin of Rising 
Star. 

The bride was given in 
marriage by her father. 

• Matron of honor was Mrs. 
Jan Clark. Mr. Jack Rutledge 
was the best man. 

The bride is a graduate of 
Rising Star High School and is 
presently attending Cisco 
Junior College. The groom is a 
graduate of Rising Star High 
School. He served two years in 
Germany with the United 
States Army and is now at-
tending Tarleton State 
University. 

The couple will live in Rising 
Star, where the bride is em-
ployed at the Twilite Acre 
Nursing Home. 

Following the ceremony, a 
reception and buffet was hosted 
by the parents of the bride and 
groom. 

- - Edward Anderson, 
Margaretta Lankford, Carla 
Lunceford, Wade Ratliff, 
Barbie Sanders and Terry 
Walker. 
SEVENTH GRADE 

A - - Konnie Harris 
B - - Shannon Childers, 

Gwyn Tharp and Jo Anne 
Carpenter 

MRS. DAVID ANDREW GRIFFIN 
nee Betty Ann Kizer 

EIGHTH GRADE 
A - - Laurie Stovall 
B - - Cindy Walker and 

Shelly Gray 

Updating Hem Lengths 

For Todays Fashion 
CM CLARKE

viz  
HAS A Lon& 

WAY 70 GO 70 EQUAL. -THE 
NUMBER OF J0135 AVAILABLE IN 
THE UNITED STALES AcZtAY.111E 
ARMY WAS OVER ZOO JOB 
TRAINING COURSES AIJO MORE 
JOBS '10 FILL THAN AAIVONE-
El-se . FIRST COME, F IRsr >ERNIE! 

RISING STAR 
HONOR ROLL 

FOURTH GRADE 
A- - Vicki Walker 
B - - Sam Scott, David 

Alford, Brad Fortune, Kathy 
Linney and Steve Hill 
FIFTH GRADE 

A- - None 
B - - Amy Dudley, Jerry 

Harris, Darlene Maynard, 
Melanie Ratliff, Paul Thornton, 
Toby White and Gretchin 
Williams. 
SIXTH GRADE 

A - - Damon Cooper and 
Regina White 

May Students Make 
Honor Roll 

Richard Windham. MAY HONOR ROLL 
FIRST GRADE 

A - - Karen Pittman 
B - - Robert Bowden, Rayme 

Krause, Wendy Lancaster, 
Randall Pickett 
SECOND GRADE 

A - - Joseph Ballard, Debbie 
Burnett, Lori Chambers, Hank 
Ingfam, Crystal Moore, Larry 
Owens. 

B - - Jimmy Crafton, Aaron 
McCallie, Steven Miller, 
Jennifer Strickland 
THIRD GRADE 

A - - Melissa Norris, Cathy 
Petross, Glenn Pittman 

B - - Terry Burnett, Sha non 
Harvey, Harold Musick. 

FOURTH GRADE 
A - - none 
B - • Bobby Burnett, Shane 

Crafton, Linda Harris, Carl 
Musick 
FIFTH GRADE 

A - - Shellon McCallie, 
Dianne Mitchell, Lynn 
Whitaker 

B - - Barbara Bowden, 
Brenda Bowden, Beverly 
Bundick, Darrien Chambers, 
Yvonne Petross 
SIXTH GRADE 

A - - Tonya Crafton, Benny 
Edwards, Jamie Epley, Gina 
Miller 

B - - Mike Cogburn 
SEVENTH GRADE 

A - - None 
B - - David Newman, 

Thayne Pittman 
EIGHTH GRADE 

A - - Susan Schweelyburger, 
Rebecca Windham 

B - - Bo Allen, Kenneth 
Hignight 

- - For straight or gathered 
skirts, cut without A - line 
seams, one or more rows of 
fabric bands or trim inserted 
above the hemline may work. 

- - Dresses without waistline 
seams can be successfully 
lengthened by adding fabric 
inserts at the waistline for a 
mock belted look or as a midriff 
to be worn either belted or 
unbelted. 

- - Long and closed vests, 
tunics or overblouses are ex- 
cellent 	lengthening 	ac- 
cessories. Adding a yoke or 
lightweight fabric to the un-
derneath section of the skirt or 
dress easily lengthens the 
hemline. 

camouflage and still look as 
though they were planned as 
part of an original garment. 

"Once the hem allowance is 
successfully let down, think 
through ways the hem edge 
could be finished: Is it best to 
add a facing, bind the raw edge, 
or turn under a narrow width 
and topstitch'?" she said. 

She suggested some other 
possibilities if letting down the 
hem allowance doesn't provide 
enough needed length. 

- - Is the garment design and 
fabric design suitable for ad-
ding a contrasting ruffle or 
band at the hemline? 

"To avoid looking 'tacked 
on', contrasting fabric or trim 
added at the hemline often also 
needs to be positioned higher on 
thegarment- - for example, as 
pockets, belts, cuffs, trim or 
applique." 

COLLEGE STATION - -
Fashionable shirts and dresses 

fare hanging unworn in many 
closets - - simply because 
they're too short for today's 
styles. 

But many of these can be 
"recycled" at little expense to 

'become useful and enjoyable 
additions to a wearable war-
drobe, Mrs. Becky Culp, area 
clothing specialist, suggests. 
She's with the Texas 

Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice, the Texas MAI 
University System. 

"Spend a few minutes 
visualizing possibilities on the 
too - short clothes. Would the 
hem allowance add enough 
needed length? If so, check to 
see if the old hemline would 
show. If it does, consider 
whether or not rows of trim or 
narrow tucks could be used for 

46- 
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1612  acres Possum Kingdom, 2200 ft. frontage, 6 lodges: Main 
lodge 2775 sq. ft. (21 1352 sq. ft., (3) 1944 sq. ft. (4) 1640 sq. ft. (5) 
1144 sq. ft., (6) 1066 sq. ft. Recreation bldg. 3600 sq. ft. All com-
pletely furnished, own water system, butane system, sewer 
system. boat dock boat launching ramp, all in good repair. For 
Sale or Trade. 

24 acres of land Lake Leon, over 1400 ft. water frontage, road 
frontage on 3 sides, needs a developer. $24000.00. 

too acres. 34  mile water frontage with 30 acres irrigated from 
wells, 1  4 mile highway frontage, pecans, deer and quail hunting, 
excellent building site. $350.00 per acre. 

260 acres approx. 112  miles water front, good house, out 
buildings, 34 mile highway frontage, pecans, 35 ac. cult. an ex-
cellent buy at $325.00 per acre. 

SMALL TRACTS OF LAND 
al 2  acres highway frontage. trees, good building site, $2000.00. 
12 acres all coastal, 4 irrigation wells, outskirts of Anson. Also 

has hog sheds and farrowing set up, completely fenced and cross 
fenced with hog wire, will G.I. $12000.00. 

25 acres, creek bottom land. highway frontage, good tank 
$10000.00. 

631 2 acres of land, secluded and rough, good grass, improved 
varieties sown, no minerals, good tank, excellent deer and bird 
hunting 34  mile off pavement, 6 miles from town. $300.00 per acre. 
Terms available, would consider G.I. plus cash. 

Two .14 acre tracts that adjoin, tank water on both, highway 
frontage, not far out, good open grass land with scattered trees, 
city water possible. $16000.00 each tract. G.I. 

lot acres good improved native pasture, close in, some trees, 
some creek bottom, net fences, 2 good tanks, good deer and bird 
hunting. City water possible. $375.00 per acre. Terms. 

70 acres coastal, good net wire fences, 2 pastures, well, tank, 
barns, close in. $400.00 per acre. City water possible. 

10 acres coastal, close in, good fences, $400 per acre. Will take 
G.I. plus cash. City water possible. 

:in acres brush land, close in, city water, excellent location, 
$14.000.00. Will G.I. 

107 acres, good fences, barns, south of Carbon, 2 tanks, one 
well, 85 percent minerals, $350.00 per acre 

1:13 acres 	rising Star, several good water wells, some 
orchard, good peanut allotment, asking $350.00 per acre, make us 
an offer. On pavement. Financing available. 

FARMS AND RANCHES 
237 acres, excellent grass land, scattered clumps of live oaks, 

good highway frontage and excellent location, 2 tanks, city water 
possible, $350.00 per acre, good terms can be arranged. 

320 acres, highway frontage, 60 ac. cultivation, now in K.R. 
bluestem, creek, well, 4 tanks, good net wire fences, excellent 
terms can be arranged. $325.00 per acre. 

540 acres improved ranch, nice house, barns, corrals, several-
pastures and traps, 3 wells, 8 tanks, 2 springs, good location, on 
pavement, good bird and deer hunting, fish in tanks, good net 
fences. $350.00 per acre. Excellent terms. 

moo acres goxl grass land, 2 wells, 8 tanks, good net fences, no 
bldgs., pavement, good location, $300.00 per acre. Excellent 
terms. 

630 acres rolling, semi open grass land, some bottom and river 
frontage, good fishing in river, pecans, several good tanks, 1 
water well, 40 ac. coastal, 25 acres grain, excellent deer hunting, 
air strip, net wire fences, 2 houses, 35 miles from city limits Fort 
Worth $350.00 per acre, excellent terms. 16 percent down balance 
to be arranged 81 2  percent interest. 

106K acres highly improved ranch located on Paluxy River, 
welded pipe corrals, landing strip and hangar, good barns, ex-
ceptionally nice 3500 sq. ft. home, 3 other houses, 80 acres coastal, 
45 acres grain, excellent fishing, deer and bird hunting, 50 miles 
from downtown Fort Worth. $600.00 per acre. Excellent terms. 15 
percent down, balance to be arranged 8 percent interest. 

The paper money we use 
today developed from a cus-
tom that began in England 
during the 1600's according 
to World Book Encyclopedia. 

This is our 
We have for sale or trade large ranches, irrigated farms, all 

sizes anywhere in the Southwest. Also motels, office buildings, 
shopping centers, commercial property of all types. Contact us 
for whatever you need. 

ROBERT NI. KINCAID REAL ESTATE 
100 South Seaman 	 Eastland, Texas 

629 - 1781 

FINAL CLEARANCE 
Robert NI. Kincaid Night Phone 629 - 2815 With 50% discount on many items. This is an 

end of season clean-up of broken sizes. 

SALE ENDS SATURDAY JANUARY 31st. 
GROUP 

Men's Dress Slacks 

Now 	1/2 	of Regular Price 

Alterations Extra 

GROUP 
Men's Suits. Sport Coats and 

Leisure Suits 

Now 	1/2 	of Regular Price 

Alterations Extra 

GROUP 

Men's Dress Felt Hats 

Now 	1/2 	of Regular Price 

GROUP 
Men's Long Sleeve Sport Shirts 

and Dress Shirts 

Now 	1/2 	Price 

"SHRINK TO FIT" 
Levi Jeans 

Reg. $12.25 to$13.25 

N ow 	
1/2 	

Price 

s 

GROUP 
Jarman and Pedwin Shoes 

and Boots  

Now 	
1/2 	

Price 

GROUP 

Men's Sweaters 

Now 1/2 	Price 

GROUP 
Ladies HANES Hose 

Reg. $1.65 to $1.75 

Now 	50c 	Pair 

GROUP 
Men's Jackets 

Now 	
1/2 	

Price 

"Our Leathers Included" 

No Returns No Lay Aways 

No Approvals All Sales Final 

THE MAN'S STORE 
&A Cilia 

CISCO 



Nimrod News 

-Eva Stroebel 

The Nimrod Neighbors 
Progressive Club held a 
meeting in the clug house F 
Jan. 12. County Agent De 
Gordon, brought a very in-
formative program on trees, 
shrubs, and gardening. The 
program, which included a 
special film, was well attended 
and appreciated. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Loyd Swindle. 

Susan and Gregg, Mr. and Mrs. 
Emmett Rich, Kathy and 
Trecia; and Mr. and Mrs. Lou 
Rich, all of Cisco, were recent 
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Rich, 

Mr. and Mrs. Emmett 
Johnson of Abilene, and Rev. 
and Mrs. Vic Allen of Cisco 
were guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
C.A. Livingston on Sunday. 
Also visiting the Livingstons 
Sunday afternoon were friends 
from South Carolina, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lawrence Shelton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Ingram 
and Lawrence of Cisco visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman Schaefer 
on Sunday. Also visiting the 
Schaefers were Mr. and Mrs. 

ill Herbert Wende of Cisco, a 
!brother of Mrs. Schaefer. 

Mrs. Eva Stroebel, who is ill 
in the E.L. Graham Memorial 
Hospital, has had a number of 
her many friends visit with her 
this week. Among them were 
Mr. and Mrs. Conrad Schaefer, 
Mr. and Mrs. Buck Sharpe, 
Mrs. Sam Hedrick, Mrs. 
Jackson, Mrs. Plez Ray and 
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Livingston. Everyone wishes 
for Mrs. Stroebel a speedy and 
complete recovery. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Ingram of 
Cisco visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Glagner on Saturday. 

NEW CAR 
REGISTRATIONS 

Mrs. Ruby Moore - - Ford -
Albany 
Jerry Don Basham - - Chev. 

Welding Truck - - Ranger 
Union Oil Co. of Calif. 

Chev. Pkup - - Midland 
J.L. Stafford - - Ford 

Cisco 
Nancy Jane Seaberry 

Ford - - Eastland 
Frank R. Schlaepfer - - Ford 

Van - - Cisco 
Village Leasing - - Chev. SW 

- - Abilene 
Chris Ball - - Dugan Flat - - 

Eastland 
BTW Const. Co. - - Chev. 

Flat - - Temple 
I.H. McMaster - - Chev. 

Pkup - - Desdemona 
T.H. Carlisle - - Chev. Pkup 

- - Zephry 
Kenneth L. R Reese • - Mere. 

- - Eastland 
Zelma and Eugene Falls - -

Ford Pkup - - Eastland 
Roy A. Trower - - Ford Pkup 

- - Ranger 
R.E. Stelle - - Ford Pkup - -

Ranger 
Mike A. Knott - - Chev. Pkup 

- - Cisco 
Vietta Marie Chestnut - -

Chev. Pkup - - Ranger 
Charles Arnett - - Olds - -

Ranger 
_ Richard L. Rossander - -
Ford - - Eastland 

MARRIAGE LICENSES 
Janathan Ketchem Van 

Winkle and Perre Faye Speer 
Danny Rubin Baldree and 

Sandra Jean De Los Santos 
Odis Arthur Smith and 

Terresa Ellen Elmore 
Dennis Ray Goss and Terry 

Jane Blackman 
Mark Allan Jackson and 

Connie Marie Norman 
INSTRUMENTS FILED 

COUNTY CLERK'S OFFICE 
Carl E. Alford and wife to 

William L. Scrogums Jr., and 
wife - - warranty deed 

Connie L. Anguiano to 
Marjorie Reeves - - warranty 
deed 

Bar H Bar, Inc. hi J.J. 
Meeker - - OGML 

Bar H Bar, Inc. to the public 
- aff'd 
Jid Blackwell to H.L. Perrin 

and wife - - warranty deed 
B.G. Brown Const. Co. Inc. to 

Joe G. Beaty and wife - -
warranty deed 

Joe G. Beaty and wife to 
Lomas and Nettleton - - deed 
of trust 

Hoyt Bryant and wife to 
Hilton Shahan - OGL 

B.G. Brown Const. Co. to J.A. 
Lyle - - deed of trust 

Juanita Blackwell to 1st St. 

I
Bk., Ranger - - deed of trust 

W.D. Brown to Clinton M. 
McCain - - revocation PA 

Dewey Cox Jr., and wife to 
Western Hills Oil and Gas - -
asgn. OGL 

E.A. Connel and wife to B.G. 
Brown Const. Co. - - warranty 
deed 

Otis K. Coleman to Eastland 
Natl Bank - - asgn. MML 

Cities Service Oil Co. to W.M. 
Sneed and wife - - release OGL 

Cecil Camp and others to 
Stanley W. Gill Jr. - - OGL 

T.M. Clark. dec'd to the 
public - - proof of heirship, will 
attached 

Mrs. R.F. Duncan to Ray 
Jenkins and wife- - rel. deed of 
trust 

J.M. Davis and others to 
Helen A. Landtroop - -
warranty deed 

Gerald Danaway and others 
to the public - - designation 
homestead 

Dwayne L. DeShone and wife 
/ to Gerald H. Neel and wife - -

warranty deed 
Enserch Corp. to C.B. Hazel 
- lease 
Eastland Natl Bank to J.R. 

Grimshaw and wife - - rel. 
deed of trust 

Eastland National Bank to 
E.A. Connel - - rel. deed of 
trust 

Roy Birtie Farley, dec'd and 
wife to the public - - proof of 
heirship 

Harvey E. Franklin to 
Western Hills Oil and Gas - -
OGL 

Farmers Peanut Co., Inc. to 
Eastland Natl Bank - - deed of 
trust 

First Fed. S&L Assn. to B.W. 
Martin - - rel, deed of trust 

Michael J. Flanagan and wife 
to Paul Washburn - - warranty 
deed 

First Fed. S&L Assn. to 
Martha S. Eukens - - rel. deed 
of trust 

1st St. Bk., Ranger to Robert 
Don Hodges and wife - - rel. 
deed of trust 

Jay Rodgers Grimshaw and 
wife to C.G. Grimshaw and wife 
- - warranty deed 

C.G. Grimshaw and wife to 
Jay Rodgers Grimshaw - -
deed of trust 

Goree Graham Est and 
others to Rhodes Dr. Co. and 
others - - °GAIL 

Charles Wayne Graham and 
wife to M.B. Gilbert - -
warranty deed 

J.W. Graham to B.J. 
Greenhaw - - quit claim deed 

Willie Lue McCracken Gray 
toJa nta Pet. Co. Inc. - - OGML 

Olga Maye Gregory and 
others to H.E. Gregory - -
warranty deed 

Estate of Geneva S. Hill, 
dec'd to the public - - cert. 
showing no inheritance tax due 

Willie P. Hamilton and wife 
to U.S.A. - - deed of trust 

Robert Don Hodges and wife 
to Henry Ross Hodges and wife 
- - warranty deed 

Henry Ross Hodges and wife 
to William E. Lummus - -
warranty deed 

Joyce R. Hoover to Doyle 
Squires and wife - - rel. VL and 
DT 

Estate of J.L. King, dec'd to 
Weldon J. Lamb and others - -
warranty deed 

John C. Koen and wife to 
Elmer D. Koen and wife - -
warranty deed 

Elmer D. Koen and wife to 
John C Koen and wife - - deed 
of trust 

Weldon J. Lamb and others to 
1st St. Bk., Rising Star - - deed 
of trust 

J.A. Lyle and wife to B.G. 
Brown Const. Co. - warranty 
deed 

J.A. Lyule and wife to 1st St. 
Bk., Ranger - - deed of trust 

J.A. Lyle and wife to B.G. 
Brown Const. Co., Inc. - -
warranty deed 

Calvin Michelson to Bobby E. 

2916 MAR14 M.P. 37 

Sun. Mon. Tues. 7:30 P.M. 

$1 00  FRANKS 
$149 

12 oz. Pkg. 	0 

69C 
EysLicicokie(? 

What happens when you're a N.Y. cop 
sent to France to bust 
a dope ring and... 
• You can't speak French 
• The French cops hate you 
• Your own people have set you up... 

andTheTistiesfeof GRIZZLY ADAMS 
COLOR BY DELUXE ,,g M140.,111 

,̀ 11974 Sun International Productions. Irc 	..g7•• 

	li 

Thursday, January 22, 1976 
Ira i a -eda 

THANK YOU! 
We want to say a big Thank you to all our 

friends and customers for their support and 

patronage during our time of business in the 
station. We also want to say congratulations 
and best wishes to the new owners of the 

Texaco service station and hope that you will 

continue to patronize Davey and Judy Jones 

as we are sure that they will do their best to 
serve you. 

Our outstanding accounts may be paid at 

the station or mailed to Box 397, Rising Star, 
Texas. 

Dwain A. Shipman v. Citizens 
Savings and Loan Association. 
(Opinion by Judge Brown, 
A.J.)--Dallas. 
. 	MOTIONS SUBMITTED 

The City of Wichita Falls et al 
v. Wilmer G. Gleghorn. Appel-
lant's motion for rehearing--Bay 

The City of Wichita Falls et al 
v. Wilmer G. Gleghorn. Appel-
lee's motion for rehearing.-• 
Baylor. 

Kenneth A. Wirtz et LIX V. 

H.N. Orr et ux. Appellee's 
motion for rehearing.--Baylor 

Kenneth A. Wirtz et ux v. 
H.N. Orr et ux. Appellant's 
motion for rehearing--Dallas. 

E.J. Porter v. Allan Streigler 
dba Rural Realty. Appellee's 
motion for rehearing--Palo Pin-
to. 

Wayne Qualls v. J.R. Wea-
therall. Appellee's motion for 
rehearing--Knox. 

MOTIONS OVERRULED 
The City of Wichita Falls et al 

v. Wilmer G. Gleghorn. Appel-
lant's motion for rehearing--
Baylor. 

The City of Wichita Falls et al 
v. Wilmer G. Gleghorn. Appel-
lee's motion for rehearing--
Baylor. 

Kenneth A. Wirtz et ux v. 
H.N. Orr et ux. Appellee's 
motion for rehearing--Dallas. 

Kenneth A. Wirtz et ux v. 
H.N. Orr et ux. Appellant's 
rnotionf or rehearing (Opinion 
by Judge McCloud)--Dallas. 

E.J. Porter v. Allan Streigler 
dba Rural Realty. Appellee's 
motion for rehearing.--Palo 
Pinto 

AUCTION 
SATURDAY 
	

10:00 a.m. 
JANUARY 24, 1976 
GORMAN, TEXAS 

Listings to date, consisting of: 1974 - - "4030" John Deere Diesel 
Tractor with cab and air, 1969 - - "4020" John Deere Diesel 
Tractor, (3) "H" Farmalls, (2) "H" John Deeres, 1968 - "1020" 
John Deere Gasoline Tractor, "600" Ford Tractor with front end 
loader, "A" Farmall tractor, old model Moline, (3) double tool 
bar chisel plows, (2) John Deere and (1) M.F. Moldboards, 
Jefferson Chisel Plow, 4 bt. Ferguson Plow, (7) grain drills, (4) 
"Long" and (2) John Deere 12' Tandem Disc, 6' tandem disc, 4 
row tool bar, 4 row I.H.C. planter, 4 row bedder, 5 row M - F 
Lister, 5 : ow Lister with power markers, 4 row rotary cultivator, 
(3) 2 row Ford cultivators, 3 row Lister, 3 pt. 8 disc one - way (2) 
3 pt. blades, 4 row stalk cutter, (3) shredders, (3) side delivery 
rakes, 3 pt. tiller, invertor peanut digger, super "Long" peanut 
combine, 1964 - - peanut combine, (2) old model peanut 
thrashers, (3) peanut diggers, 3 pt. danuser post hole digger (2) 
old "Long" combines, 4" turbine water pump, (26) 40' joints 4" 
pipe, (24) 30' joints 3" sprinkler pipe, 72' - 8" well casing pipe, 
irrigation pipe trailer, new gooseneck trailer, 6 x 20' gooseneck 
stock trailer, 14' Hale open top stock trailer, new 6 x 16' and 5 x 16 
all metal covered stock trailer, (2) old trailer houses, pickup 

camper, lot of 2 x 4's lumber, air compressor, 1974 Chevrolet 1 /2  
ton pickup, jeep with 4 wheel drive, 1950 studebaker peanut truck, 
1950 Chevrolet peanut truck plus tools, sweeps, busters, foot 
pieces, and other farm related items too numberous to list. 
Loadert tractor available. No charge, courtesy of auctioneer. 

For further information contact: Troy Johnson, Phone 817 - 734 -
5367, Gorman, Texas. 

Lie. Tx. - GC 76 - 0258 
(Full Time Auctioneer) 

P.O. Box 55, Lawn, Texas 
Ph. 915 - 583 - 2244 
Lunch Available 

Thanks again, for your patronage. 

Sandy and Mack Elliott 
a 00 

ACCIDENT omme• 
2705 MAR 74 M.P. 34 

Be Secure ...With 
Complete Coverage 

Majestic Theatre 
Eastland 	 629.1220 

Thurs. Fri. Sat. 7:30 P.M. Mat. Sat. 2 P.M 

We don't like to think about 

accidents and possible injuries on 

the farm. But they may happen 

even on the safest of farms. 

Protect yourself with insur-

ance that covers hospitalization 

... offers good compensation. 

See Us for Details 

DOUBLE msnEy ADUEDTURE For Big 
Events! 
A very special 
occasion needs 
a very special 
printer. Ask us. 

Your Local 

Newspaper 

ROUSING ACTION! THRILLING EXCITEMENT! 

R.L. Buckley 
Insurance Agency 

sielzsi6nammisione643-4421 
MEMBER 

TEXAS PRESS 
ASSOCIATION 

MPS MI MP Win Mt 3 FOR 

aeliii••••1•111•01Binnir 
Solid 

• MARGARINE 

Moore - - overriding royalty 
asgn. 

Calvin Michelson to Mendel 
Kaliff - asgn. OGML 

Irene S. Mayfield to Janta 
Pet. Co., Inc. - - OGML 

Bessie Marie McCollum to 
Rhodes Dr. Co. and others - -
OGML 

John Edward McKelvain, 
dec'd to the public - - proof of 
ehirship 

H.L. Perrin and wife to 1st St. 
Bk., Ranger - - deed of trust 

C.L. Pittman and wife to B.G. 
Timmons and wife - -
warranty deed 

Kenneth Rawson and wife to 
Eastland Natl Bk. - - deed of 
trust 

Jerry C. Squires and wife to 
Billy Fallin and wife - - bill of 
sale 

H.J. Stephenson Est., and 
others to Rhodes Dr. Co. - -
OGML 

Hildegard Stephen to Martin 
Stephan - - power of atty. 

W.U. Shannon and wife to 
Myrtle Val Patterson - - MD 

Herman E. Stephan to 
Stanley M. Call - - OGL 

O.R. Shults to Janta Pet. Co. 
Inc. - - OGML 

Lillian Ladair Smith to the 
public • - proof of heirship 

G.O. Strong to Mrs. M.G. 
Smith - - bill of sale 

Trans - Tex Motels, Eastland 
to State of Texas - - notice 
state tax lien 

— Jane Marie Tracy to the 
Grant Co. - - ratification OGL 

B.G. Timmons and wife to 1st 
St. Bk., Ranger- - deed of trust 

Tri - Mark Dev. Inc. to Willie 
P. Hamilton and wife - -
warranty deed 

M.L. Terrell and wife to W.S. 
Wagley, trustee - - warranty 
deed 

United States to Billy J. 
Gregg - - notice fed, tax lien 

United States to Johnnie A 
and Kay Watson - - notice fed. 
tax lien 

United States to Johnnie 
Watson and others - - notice 
fed. tax lien 

The Wet Spot to the public - -
assumed name 

Western Hills Oil and Gas to 
Lynn Ball - - asgn. OGL 

Western Hills Oil and Gas to 
Wm. A. Dennison and others -
- asgn. OGL 

Western Hills Oil and Gas to 
Ann Colbins Fletcher - - asgn. 
OGL 

Paul Washburn to 1st St. Bk., 
Ranger - - extension DT 

91st DISTRICT COURT 
Annie Bernice Brooks vs. 

Randy Brooks - - divorce 
Bessie B Genova White 

Bowers vs. Harmon Carl 
Bowers - - divorce 

Estelle Allison Chew vs. 
Tommy Darrell Chew - 
divorce 

First State Bank, Rising Star 
vs. Robbie Autrey - - kilt on 
note 

M.A. Ellis vs. E.M. Carter 
and others 4 - receivership 

Ida Lou • Putnam Neal vs. 
Harley Lee Neal - - divorce 

Henry Franklin Burrow vs. 
Tex. Dept. of Public Safety - -
to appeal suspension of drivers 
license 

The following proceedings 
were had in the Court of Civil 
Appeals. Eleventh Supreme 
Judicial District of Texas 
January 15. 1976: 
REVERSED AND REMANDED 

E.J. Porter v. Allan Streigler 
dba Rural Realty (Opinion by 
Judge McCloud. C.J.)--Palo 
Pinto 

trrensure  
isiond 

BOBBY DRISCOLL 
ROBERT NEWTON • BASIL SYDNEY 

5 lb. Bag 

Dr.Syn 
alias The Scarecrow 

s.,—,PATRICK McGOOHAN 
GEORGE COLE • TONY BRITTON . SEAN SCULLY 

moo sok • inmate Prefrer Higoi AISWas 
Dan led in JAWS AntSal • Scquic4, D, ROBERT NESTERS/ 

"z• z•zzzte C.^ z. 

loci 
59c 

' Jan 79 TECHNICOLOR" 	G Qt. 
T.,>1.4tyyr  
PERU PEARCE BYRON BASCH LAKRENCE E WATION 

TECHNICOLOR' • Q 

Per Gal. $11 

Per Lb. 39' 

29 Oz. 
59c 

Per Can 35` 

3 Lb. Can $139 

Per Lb. $129  

6 Jars For $1
00 

 

$1 
044  

Decker's 	LE 
5 Lb. Bag Cane 

Bordens 

-111  MILK 
Sweet Sixteen 

Ea OLEO 
It Sliced 

PEACHES 
:10 

 
Del Monte 

GREEN BEANS 
isc Mrs. Tucker 

SHORTENING 

BACON
Slab 

 
Strained 

BABY VEGETABLES 

FOR 3 Reg. Cans 3 
Cut 

Kimbells 

• FLOUR 
▪ Kimbells 

• SALAD DRESSING 
•  

• SUGAR 
•  
01  CORN 
•  
• Honey Boy 

▪ SALMAN 
• Kimbells 

• CAKE MIX 
• Kimbells 

COCONUT 
•  
• POTATOES 

Fresh Ground 
• HAMBURGER 

1 lb. Tall Can Each 

49` 	Armour Sliced 

95C 	SLAB 
BACON 

Reg. Pkg. • • • • • • • • 

14 oz. Pkg. 

pr imes:trews sr gain  

n ONIONS 	CARROTS 

g 	per Lb. 26c 	! 2 Bags For 25c 
Windirann =NW 

Lee's Food Market 
Double Buccaneer Stamps On Wednesdays 

10 lb. Bag 89c 

Per lb. 69c SEE ear 
NACKAIM (EXPLODE 

IN THE Au. NEW FRSVal 

OWNECnOtd 

Our Prices Are Lower 
fir•Th • 	 • 
I-cOX-I • 	 • E.F. Agnew & Sons 

F

IIIRESTRICTED1  
2,17T A kiA40‘.6 NEW sir uP 

J  • 	 • Rising Star's Farortie Food Store Since 1920 

Double SETH Green Stamps On Wednesday 	• 

3/44-•10.1.1110110.10.0111011.1111.  

Coming Feb. 1-2-3 d 
• 
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