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Class Of 1963 Has Gone A Long Way Jami Long Top Sub - Junior 

By Ben A. Butler 

Carla Thornhill Signs 
Letter Of Intent With CJC 

• 

Isaac Newton--discoverer of 
the law of gravity--another 
member of the honor four-
some of the 1963 Rising Star 
class today is expanding his 
scholastic horizons in post-
doctorate study. He is Don 
Donham, salutatorian of that 
class, and the achiever of a 
Doctor of Philosophy degree 
in Anthropology from a 
prestigious American 
institution of learning--
Leland Stanford, Jr., 
University at Palo Alto, Calif. 
Don went to Cambridge Uni-
versity, Cambridge, Eng., 
this year on a grant from the 
National Science Foundation, 
itself a mark of highest 
excellence in the scholastic 
field. 

Mansfield where she devotes 
herself to gardening, home 
management and private 
tutoring while awaiting a 
second child early in 1979. 
Most TV viewers will recall 

film strips of a 707 airplane 
taking off with a wingless 
space ship clutching its back 
like an eaglet on a giant bird. 
Far above the earth the chick 
leaves the mother ship and 
rockets into the weightless-
ness of space, then returning 
with unfolded wings to land 
like a normal plane. 
The spectacle represents 

the formative stage of a 
space shuttle designed to 
carry people and commodi-
ties to and from satellites far 
above the earth, envisioned 
as eventual cities permantly 
afloat in space, sustained 
there by laws of physics 
having to do with inertial 
forces and permanence of 
motion in a balance of gravi-
tational attraction. 
What they do not see is a 

young 	man 	rather 
handsomely moustached 
sitting in a post of high 
responsibility for the perfor-
mance of that shuttle. He is a 
Rising Star boy who is having 
much to do with the evolution 
of this dream of an expand-
ing civilization, free of the 
vicissitudes of our earthly 
environmant--a sort of 
material Valhalla, destined 
perhaps to the proportions of 
a vast new frontier. 

Kenneth Nunnally, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Nunnally, 
with a grade average of 
93.000. 

Two of the four chose the 
scholastic field for their 
careers; one went into space 
technology, and the fourth 
answered the challenge of 
industrial opportunity. 
The last mentioned was 

Kenneth Nunnally whose 
briefly worded record 
reflects all too modestly 
significant accomplishments 
in the area of industrial 
chemistry which have 
contributed to the life styles 
and satisfaction of so many 
who use the products of the 
great Dow Chemical 
complex. 
Kennth went to Abilene 

Christian College--now 
university--from which he 
graduated in 1967 with a 
major in chemistry. In June 
of his graduate year he 
began work in the Dow 
Chemical Company's Free-
port, Tex., laboratory. In the 
time spent there his creative 
work produced three patents 
for the company, no mean 
contribution 	to 	the 
expanding pattern of that 
vast industrial complex in 
service to the American 
standard of living. 
His work won him transfer 

to the production side of the 
company, where he is 
presently supervisor of a 
new, computerized styene 
plant in the Gulf Coast area. 
Within ten years the 
"rookie" advanced to a front 
line player in a field where 
competition in mind and 
ability is, to put it mildly, 
quite keen. He should go far. 

has 
with 

Ft. Worth and Abilene on 
Interestate Highway 20, and 
the college occupies a 
ninety- two- acre campus. 
Its curriculum include full 
academic program leading 
to degrees in all provessional 
fields, a comprehensive 
technical- vocational 
program, and a great 
variety of community 
courses. CJC's ability to 
offer five different degrees 
and fifty different majors, 
teamed with its ac-
creditation with the Southern 
Association o of Colleges and 
Universities justifies the 
claim that Cisco Junior 
College is one of the fastest 
growing junior colleges in 
the state of Texas. 

We will be competing in 
the tough Northern Texas 
Junior College Athletic 
Conference composed of 
Ranger Junior, Southwest 
Christian College (Terrell), 
McLennan 	Community 
College (Waco), Grayson 
County College (Dennison), 
Weatherford Junior College 
and Cooke County College 
(Gainesville). 

Carla Thornhill of May 
signed a letter of intent 
Cisco Junior College with a 
basketball scholarship. 

Carla is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Thornhill. 
She g graduated third in her 
class and received numerous 
honors at May High School. A 
starter on the 1977 Class B 
State Runner- Up team, she 
is a three year all- district 
player, numerous all-
tournament selections, and 
was selected on the All-
Regional Tourney team. 

Carla placed 5th in the 
discus at the 1978 State Trade 
meet. She has all the 
qualities needed to be an 
outstanding College player. 
She averaged 20 points per 
game and 16 rebounds. 

"She is a tough aggressive 
competition, one who is 
fundamentally sound and a 
team player. CJC an-
ticipates great play and 
leadership from Carla," 
stated Jirpmie Campbell, 
Women's basketball coach at 
CJC. 

Cisco is located between 

ENOUGH IS ENOUGH 

Kay Prosser 

Mrs. John Kida modeled a 
khaki colored sundress. She 
recieved a red ribbon. 
Five Sub-Junior 4-Hers 

entered the Dress Revue. 
Jami Long, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Rex Long of Rising 
Star was the top sub-junior. 
She modeled a yellow sun-
dress with a tie belt and a 
ruffle at the bottom. Jami 
also made a matching shawl 
with a ruffle to complete her 
outfit. For her prize Jami will 
also receive a dress length of 
fabric from J.C. Penney's. 
Other Sub-Junior 

participants receiving blue 
ribbons were Jeanine Reich, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Reich; and Sue Ann 
Osborne, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Phillip Osborne. 
Jeanine made a three tiered 
flowered skirt and an ivory 
colored ruffled blouse. Sue 
Ann modeled a three tiered 
navy blue skirt with lace 
between each tier. She pur-
chased a white top to 
complete her outfit. 
Robin White received a red 

ribbon for her flowered print 
sundress. She is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie White of Eastland. 
Wendy High, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Kirby, 
received a red ribbon for her 
white pantsuit. 
Ruthie Hagood, Patri 

Spurlen, and Jami Long will 
be competing in the District 
Fashion Revue to be held 
July 25th in Waco. 
Jeanne Hounsel was the 

commentator for the County 
Dress Revue. Jeanne was 
last year's winner of the 
County Revue. She also won 
at the District Dress Revue 
and participated in the State 
Dress Revue. 
A reception after the Dress 

Revue was sponsored by the 
Eastland County Home 
Demonstration Council. 

Don Donham 
From Rising Star Don went 

to Baylor University at Waco 
where he graduated Magna 
Cum Laude (with highest 
honors) and a B.A. degress 
majored in chemistry and,  
math, in 1967. His scholastic 
path took him to Stanford 
and a Masters degree in 
chemistry; to William and 
Mary College in Virginia; to 
Tulane University, New 
Orleans, and back to 
Stanford for a doctorate in 
Anthropology in 1977. The 
sequence of his scholastic 
career speaks enough for his 
record. But a word signifi-
cant of his character may be 
added. While a student in 
Rising Star High School he 
added the study of piano to 
his elective curriculum solely 
for its cultural benefits and 
self-pleasure. With the same 
sober dedication that he 
applied to his career studies 
he became one of the best 
young amateur musicians to 
leave Rising Star, and no 
doubt when his classroom 
and research duties become 
irksome he still relaxes at the 
keyboard. 
What a contribution to a 

needy, and sometimes short-
sighted, community these 
youth. and others as 
distinguished, could make if 
only a sufficient challenge 
were here to attract their 
ambitious spirits! But who 
can blame them for seeking 
inspiration and success else-
where? 
We are the products of our 

conflicts, and the competi-
tion of equal minds summons 
forth the best achievemtn of 
which we are capable. With-
out that challenge the 
individual stagnates. 
That is something for those 

of us who see and bemoan 
the slow decay of the small 
towns might profitably think 
about! 

"Summer Garden 
Fashions" was the theme of 
the 1978 Eastland County 
Dress Revue. The annual 4-H 
event was held Saturday, 
July 8th at the Ranger Junior 
College Auditorium. 
In the senior division, 

Ruthie Hagood, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Hagood of Gorman, took top 
honors. Ruthie's outfit 
consisted of a skirt and 
blouse. Her pink flowered 
skirt is gathered to the 
waistband with a ruffle on 
the bottom. The skirt is fully 
lined. Ruthie's ruffled and 
laced blouse has raglan 
sleeves with buttoned cuffs. 
It is yoked and gathered to 
the buttoned back opening. 
For her top placing, Ruthie 
will receive a dress length of 
fabric from the J.C. Penny 
store in Cisco. 
Carla Hargrove, daughter 

of Mr. and Mrs. Carl S. 
Hargrove of Cisco, was the 
other senior division partici-
pant. Carla received a red 
ribbon for her red sundress 
trimmed with red flowered 
print ruffles. 
Patri Spurlen, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. F.L. Spurlen of 
Eastland was the first place 
winner in the Junior division. 
Patri's three peice outfit 
consisted of a three tiered 
skirt, a camisole top, and a 
reversible shawl. Ruffles and 
lace accent Patri's ensemble. 
She used two coordinated 
blue colored fabrics through-
out her outfit. Patri also 
made a slip and camisole to 
be worn with her outfit. Patri 
will also receive a dress 
length of fabric from the J.C. 
Penny Store. 
Leanne Brown and Shiley 

Kidd were the other Junior 
participants in the revue. 
Leanne, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Lawson C. Brown 
received a blue ribbon for her 
blue and pink shirt and top. 
Shirley, daughter of Mr. and 

Wright and Childers Attend FFA 

Mike Fisher 
He is Mike Fisher whose job 

at the Houston-based NASA 
IBM Federal Systems is 
hidden behind the giant 
computer complex which he 
helps program to govern 
every mechanical thought 
and motion of the space 
shuttle testing projects. He 
has the title of associate 
programmer, Gound Based 
Systems, a job to which he as 
promoted last year. 
Mike--diminutive for 

Michael--arrived at his pre-
sent job via a B.A: in Physics 
from Texas A&M. • and 
assignment to Holmon Air 
Force Base, Almagordo. 
N.M., where he worked in 
the White Sands Missle Test-
ing Program. 
He was commended for his 

work in tracking and recover-
ing erring missies flown from 
Utah to the White Sands 
Range. using a discovery 
process of recomputering 
flight data on inflight 
missies. Two years of this 
and he went to Baylor Uni-
versity for an M.A. degree: 
taught physics at TSTI in 
Waco for almost two years. 
and in 1974-'76 earned a PhD 
in Geophysics at Texas 
A&M. He went to work for 
IBM at NASA in September 
1976. 
He relaxes by taking part in 

theatrical productions. 
appearing this summer in a 
role 	in 	"Promises, 
Promises." musical version 
of "The Apartment," and by 
singing in the Bay Area 
Chorus of 100 voices which 
last Christmas presented 
Handel's "The Messiah" in 
Nasa auditorium. 
Walking under the 

medieval arcades of an 800-
year-old center of learing 
hallowed by the spirits of 
Disiderins Erasmus, the 
martyred William Tyndale, 
and that giant of early 

• scientific reformation, Sir 

Last Spring the girls of 
Rising Star High School won 
the Class B track and field 
championship of the State. It 
was quite an athletic distinc-
tion, a matter of pride to the 
students and patrons and, 
taken in common with other 
records of the school, an 
evidence of a well-rounded 
program. 
It was not the first time, 

however, that the Wildcats, 
as they are called in totem, 
have enhanced the athletic 
dinstinction of their school. 
Rising Star football teams of 
the late "forties" twice 
advanced as far as 
Interscholastic League regu-
lations then permitted -- to 
convincing regional titles --
and there was plenty of 
expert opinion to rate them 
the best in the State. Wildcat 
teams have since gone to 
district football champion-
ships, to district and regional 
track and field titles, and 
ranked high in basket ball 
competition. 
But this article is not a 

celebration of Rising Star 
High 	School 	atheltic 
achievements, That has been 
done, as deserved, many 
times in the local and distant 
press. A matter of fact it has 
sometimes been overdone to 
the discredit of the funda-
mental purpose and the 
excellence of the all-around 
school program. Why, one 
may ask, should a boy, or 
girl, who runs a hundred 
yards in 9.7 seconds rate 
florid headlines, while the 
same youngster who puts a 
9.7 or 9.5 scholastic average 
on his record must wait until 
graduation to receive a polite 
mention of his or her 
achievement? 
It is the intent of this article 

to offer some tribute to the 
many high school graduates 
who have earned high grades 
in study and gone forth to 
justify those grades in places 
of honor and distinction in 
the wide, wide world of 
intellectual. scientific and 
political opportunity. 
Because the limits of 

newspaper space are 
tyrannical, I have chosen the 
post-graduate records of the 
honor students of one 
remarkable class as 
indicative of a general 
scholastic excellence 
equalling, if not exceeding. 
the athletic achievements of 
the school. The example is 
both quantitative and quali-
tative -- quantitative because 
rarely do so many members 
of a graduating honor roll in 
a student body of less than 
100 achieve distinction in 
their following careers, and 
qualitative because of the 
degrees of their distinction. 
It is a sort of microcosm 
plucked from an overall • pattern of good teaching and 
good scholarship. 

I wish it were possible to list 
all who have made similar 
-successes. But the theme 
here is one of a reasonable 
anticipation -- how faithfully 
the pattern of careers has 
reflected the pattern of 
scholastic accomplishment - 
evoked by the instruction and 
challenges of the local class-
rooms. 

The four honor graduates of 
the 1963 class, as suggested. 
represent a considerable 
percentage of their group. 
They were: 
Kay Lewis, daughter of Mr. 

and Mrs. L.L. Lewis, 
valedictorian with a grade 
average of 97.375; 
Don Donham, son of Mrs. 

Helen Donham, salutatorian 
with an average of 97.306; 
Michael Fisher, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. Art Fisher, who 
averaged 95.960, and 

whenever possible or 
practical. This decision was 
made in order to insure that 
all leaking pipe would be 
replaced. But if any persn 
wants their meter set at any 
particular place it is left up 
to the gas commissioner, 
W.G. "Bill" Reed, to make 
the final decision. 

I am making a personal 
appeal to everyone to 
cooperate 	with 	com- 
missioner Reed and the 
pipeline crew in the work 
they are doing. It is very 
important that the work be 
completed before cold 
weather arrives. 
I am sure that Bill 

welcomes a any constructive 
criticism that any of us can 
offer. But to stop his work 
and haggle over a ditch 
being cut in the yard or who 
is responsible for this and 
that is a different matter. 
Enough is enough. 

Nobody gets any pleasure 
out of digging ditches or 
laying pipe in anybody's 
yard i in 103 degree heat. 
Nobody is deliberately 
persecuting anybody in this 
matter. 

If any citizen doesn't want 
Bill Reed to dig a ditch in 
their yard then it is perfectly 
all right with me if Bill lets 
them dig their own ditch and 
reset their own meter. 

We have a choice. If we 
want gas this winter, we had 
better let Bill dig the ditch 
and lay the new gas line. The 
chances are real good that 
all the ditches and all the 
pipe will be installed by 
October 1 and all the gas in 
our old gas lines will be gone. 
The Mayor. 

City officials made the 
decision to install a new gas 
distribution system within 
the City limits in 1977. Money 
was obtained ma terails were 
purchased and the in-
stallation of the system was 
begun in July. 

The decision to do this was 
brought about when the 
officials were convinced that 
we faced a very serious 
crises in our gas system 
operations. 

Evidently many of our 
citizens are not satisified 
that the crises exists. I will 
attempt to explain it again. 

We bought 105,000,000 
million cubic feet of gas in 
1977 and paid $210,000 for it. 
We sold 50,000,000 cubic feet 
of gas and received $200,000 
for it. 

No Corporation no city nor 
any individual can stay in 
business for very long if they 
depend on these kind of 
figures to make a living. If 
any citizen wants additional 
facts and figures concerning 
gas purchases, sales and 
operation expense, we invite 
you to come to City Hall and 
check it out. The records are 
public. 
I think the people 

currently installing the gas 
pipeline in the east part of 
town east of highway 183 are 
doing a good job. They are 
certainly working hard at it 
in weather that keeps most 
of us in the shade. 

They are certainly entitled 
to our cooperation and don't 
need open harasment of their 
efforts to please evry citizen. 

City officials made the 
decision to install new 
pipeline to every meter 

Senior Citizens 
Host Seventeen 

For Luncheon 

The senior citizens met July 
11 for business and games. 
We hope to have news about 
a new center soon. Atten-
dance is down some. Hot 
weather and family reunions 
along with vacations has 
taken a toll. We had seven-
teen present and a 
visitor--welcome, Melissa 
Cohen, from California. 
We give special thanks to 

Steve and Juanita Hollis for 
the donation of a nice clean 
delivered refrigerator to the 
center. 
We were host to seventeen 

for the Chamber of Com-
merce luncheon July 13. 

Reporter, 
Rilla Rlchberg 

Gospel Effort Continues 

Special evangelistic services 
are slated to continue 
through Friday evening at 
the local Church of Christ, 
according to Owen Aikin. 

The evening meetings are 
at 7:30. Short, inspirational 
services are also being held 
in the mornings at 7 a.m. 

Mike Peters, a dynamic 
preacher f from Shreveport, 

Louisiana, is doing the 
speaking at both daily 
gatherings. 

Aikin adds: "We urge all 
our friends and neighbors in 
Rising Star to take ad-
vantage of these few 
remaining meetings." 

Anyone needs tran-
sportation is invited to call 
643- 6162, 	as 	early as 
possible. 

celebrated the 50th an-
niversary of FFA, had as its 
theme "FFA at 50: A Golden 
Past and A Brighter 
Future". Created in 1928 the 
Future Farmers of America 
has had almost a million 
members since its inception. 
In its first half century the 
organization has been noted 
for its distinguished con- 
tributions 	to 	youth, 
leadership, agriculture and 
vocational education. 
Current FFA programs 
encompass every phase of 
agriculture from livestock 
production to development of 
leadership to agricultural 
economics. 

At the convention, out-
standing FFA members 
were 	recognized 	for 
significant achievement in 
FFA programs including 
supervised farming 
agribusiness and leadership. 
Also, more than $300,000 in 
college scholarships was 
presented to 70 FFA 
members 	by 	nine 
organizations that are long 
time supporters of FFA. 

Local FFA chapter 
members attended the 50th 
Anniversary Convention of 
the Texas Association of 
Future Farmers of America, 
July 11- 14, at the San An-
tonio Convention Center. 
Attending the convention 
were Eric Wright and 
Shannon Childres. 

More than 6,000 persons 
attended the four day con-
vention, the highlight of the 
year's activities in FFA. 
Some 1,600 voting delegates 
representing 828 chapters in 
the state were on hand to 
elect officers for the coming 
year and to honor out-
standing members of the 
organization. 

Texas is the state with the 
largest membership in FFA. 
There are more than 60,000 
members and the national 
organization has drawn 
many of its national officers 
from the ranks of the Texas 
membership. The current 
national FFA president is J. 
Ken 	Johnson 	from 
Nacodoches. 

The convention which 

The record of Kay Lewis, 
now Mrs. Jerry Prosser of 
Arlington, Texas, offers no 
spectacular 	single 
accomplishment. but is 
marked by a steady perfor-
mance at a consistently high 
level of achievement and 
nomination. 
From Rising Star High 

School Kay went to Cisco 
Junior College where she 
repeated her Rising Star 
success as the valedictorian 
of her collegiate class with an 
average of 3.9, one-tenth of a 
point short of perfection. 
Then in further emphasis of 
her scholastic competence 
she finished fourth in a 
graduating class of 1.500 at 
Texas University at Arling-
ton! 
En route to these honors 

she served, at CJC. as lab 
assistant in the science 
department. conducted work 
shops in math for high school 
teachers and was named 
most outstanding student in 
Math and Science. At Arling-
ton U. she was pledged to 
Phi Mu Service Soroity. was 
a member of the BSU Math 
Club. served as dean 
counsellor to her dormitory 
and as a grader and 
counsellor in the math 
department. 
After graduation she went 

on to a teaching career in 
Nichols Junior High and Sam 
Houston High of the Arling-
ton public school system. At 
Sam Houston she was spon-
sor for the Honor Society, 
counsellor in basics for lag-
ging students, head of the 
Math department and named 
teacher of the year for the 
1974-'75 term. 
Meanwhile she married 

Jimmy Prosser of Arlington 
and Valley Mills in 1971, and 
in 1975 she retired from 
teaching to await the birth of 
their first child, Jason Allen, 
who arrived on Sept. of that 
year. She and her family now 
live in a new home near 
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For Sale: Registered 
Brahman Bulls and Heifers, 
Red and Gray. Prices from 
5350.00 Contact Rodney C. 
Stephens 	Phone 
817-893-6711 Business or 
817-893-6766 home. 	7-8tc 

75 Chev. Malibu Classic, 2 
dr., v-8, air, Automatic, P.S., 
P.B.. One Owner. 
73 Dodge Charger, 2 dr., 

air, P.B., P.S., Automatic, 
etc. with only 48,825 miles 
One Owner. 

74 Ford Ranger XLT, F-100, 
air, P.B., P.S., Automatic, 
Am-Fm-Tape deck, & under 
25,000 miles. 
74 Chev. Malibu, Standard, 

2 dr, Under 50,000 miles One 
Owner. 
78 Lincoln Continenal, 4 

dr., Town Car, Fully Loaded, 
6,000 miles Our Personal car, 
Save $2,300. 

74 Ford Ranger XLT, F-250, 
air, P.B.. P.S., Automatic, 
Camper special, One Owner, 
76 Scout 3 speed. 4 cyl., 

pickup, never tilted. miles 
4.282. 
72 Pontiac Catalina-Power, 

air, automatic, local car. 
76 Scout Traveler, air, P.B., 

P.S., Am-Fm, v-8, Very good 
condition, low miles, chrome 
wheels, fold down rear seat, 
and much more. 

771/2  924 Porsche. 4 cyl., 
fuel injected, hatch-back, 
sun roof, Am-Fm-Tape-CB, 
P.B., P.S., air, automatic. 
loaded, clean, still in 
warranty. 
73 Intl Travellall, 

automatic, P.B.. P.S., air, 
cruise, clean, 392-v8, low 
miles, very good. 
71 Ford 1/2 ton L.W.B. 1/2  

ton, v-8, air, automatic. 
67 Ford S.W.B., 1/2  ton. 
75 3/4  ton, H. Duty, Intl 

L.W.B. Pickup, with all 
extras (Demo). 

JOHNSTON TRUCK 
725-6181 Cross Plains 

29-2tc 

FOR SALE 1977 LTD 
Landau, 2 dr., Fully 
loaded w-electric 
windows, locks, 50-50 
split bench seat, power 
driver's seal, reclining 
passenger seat, trunk lid 
release, digital clock, etc., 
15,000 miles. Asking 
$7300. Call 18171 
442-2004. TF 

( FOR SALJ 

FOR SALE: 3 bedrooms; A 
bath; carport for, two ears; 
garage for I car; concrete 
cellar. Lot is 80 by 180. East 
mills phone 643-1941 or 
643-6861, Grace Jenkins. 
22-tfc 

FOR SALE - 1973 Impala 
Chevrolet Sedan; 350 En-
gine; Power Brakes and 
steering; Extra Clean Car. 
54,000 actual miles. Ph. 725-
6509, J.E. Key 27-tfc 

NOTICE 
Carpet 	cleaning- heavy 

shampoo followed by cold 
water 	rinse, 	extractor 
removes all dirt into barrel. 

Is your carpet flooded? 
Have machine to remove or 
extract water from carpet. 
References in Rising Star. 
Phone D.T. Boyd (915- 356-
2454. 52- tfn 

IMPORTANT 
Check your ad the First 

Day it appears. In event of 
errors, 	please 	call 
immediately to have it 
corrected. No claims will 
be allowed for more than 
one incorrect insertion. 
The publishers liability 

shall be limited to only the 
amount of space 
consumed by these 
errors. 

THE LOBO 
Heads and Thr.:acis Slip 
709 Avenue . _Cisco 

Custom T..-it::, is 
Transfer and letters 
Men's and Women's 
Precision Hair Design 

Fashion Jeans 
Call 442-9979 

Now Sub- Station 
For Car Tags 

Jenkins Insurance Agency 
is now a sub- station for the 
sale of Car Tags- Come by 
our office or phone 643- 2251 
for more information. 

NOTICE Gooseneck 
hauling and day work. 
Also cattle 	bought and 
sold. Call Charlie For-
tenberry 725- 6607 
(Pioneer) or 725- 6307. 
51- tfc 

CHEMICAL HERBICIDE-
FUNGICIDE APPLICATOR 
A patented process for 

chemical application through 
irrigation systems. The most 
economical and efficient 
method of accurate chemical 
application on small or large 
fields. Approved by Okla-
homa State University. 
Primarily designed for the 
peanut industry, it is very 
adaptable to other crops. 
Manufactured in sizes 3" 
through 8" mainline. Several 
major chemical companies 
have EPA clearance for this 
type chemical distribution. 
Check with your chemical 
companies for approved 
chemicals for applications 
through irrigation lines. 

AGRICULTURE 
A Div. of Crown Pump Corp. 

Hwy. 16 De Leon, Texas 
Phone 817-893-2495 

Reliable Life Ins. Co. 
of Abilene 

Has an Immediate Opening 
For A sales Representative 

To Service An Established 
Debit 	• 

In This Area 
No Experience Necessary 

Company Benefits 
In interested call Henry 

Palecios 
or Tony Gage at (915) 677- 

9031 
or come by 281 N. Willis 

WANTED: Welders and 
yard hands apply at WW 
Gate and Panel Co. Hwy. 
80 East in Eastland or call 
629-8062. T52 

NOTICE- Anyone with infor-
mation regarding land-
owners of 1920's John and 
Anna Benshoof and son Dean 
Charles Oscar and Delwin E. 
please contact R.E. Benson 
2509 Browns Lane, Louisville 
Kentucky 40220-1-502-451-
2301. t58 

REAL ESTATE 

53 Acres with two tanks, 
40 pecan trees, good 
grass. 5 miles East of 
Rising Star on Highway 
36. $400 per acre. 37 acres, 
6 miles east of Rising 
Star, All grass, lots of 
timber, deer, birds and 
other wildlife, real good 
tank and well fenced 
$15,000.00 

LISTINGS Appreciated. 

Cogburn Realty 
phone 893-6666 
DeLeon 

WANT TO SELL YOUR 
LAND? 
WE WORK FULL TIME ON 
LAND SALES 
FOR QUICK 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE 
CONTACT 

JACKSON REALTY 
205 A N. Center 
Brownwood 
915- 646- 6241 
21- 6tc 

160•11.111•410114411.•410•111111•11111 

For Sale- Spring 
Special. 2 extra wide 
Lake Leon Lease lots. 
Oak trees, rustic. Good 
roads. Located on catfish, 
bass channel. Near Lone 
Cedar Country Club, nice 
area, golfing, etc. Ideal 
for trailor or building. 
Write P.O. Box 29 or call 
629- 2413. tf 

FOR SALE: 2 Bedroom 
House; I bath. To be moved. 
Located at May, Tex. Ph. 
817-643-1344. 29-tfc 

2 houses S. Main on 1/2  A. 
Lot; Trees, garden space. 

The Rising Star 
Jaycees meet every 
monday night at 8 p.m. in 
the Jayce Building 
located on South Main 
Street. 

Pres. - Charlie Moore. 
Vice- Pres. Morr 

DeLong. 
Sec.. - Treas. - Scot 

Felker 

WANTED PICKUP! Will 
Pay Instant Cash. For 
older model with decent 
running motor and solid 
body, one-half or three-
fourths ton Chevrolet or 
Ford, 1959 through 1969. 
Don't expect it to be like 
new, but no junkers, 
please. Phone early 
mornings or late evenings 
Rising Star [817] 643-
4592. 

CONCRETE FOUNDA- 
TIONS 

Driveways, patios, side- 
walks. Free estimates. 
THEARL CONSTRUC- 

TION CO., 
1300 Front St., Cisco, 

442-2476. 
tf 

R.D. CREECH 
HAULING 
Locations 	Dozer 
Work 	 Sand 
Pads 	 Caliche 
Road Work 	Gravel 

Phone 643- 3613 Day or 
Night. Night 643- 4236. 11 

WANT TO BUY 80 to 250 
acres o of land in this area. 
Will pay cash or terms. Must 
have some minerals and 
water. Improvements are 
fine but not necessary. Send 
complete details to Bernice 
Bibb 	1308 	Magnolia 
Brownwood, Texas 76801. 
23- 8tc 

COINS 
We carry a complete 

stock of coins. 	Coin 
jewelry and supplies. 

Gold. Silver. U.S. and 
Foreign 

Lay-away plan available. 
Pratt's Coin Shop . 

Abilene 

2155 So. 1st 	672-6991 

NOTICE-We buy sell or 
Trade Quality Cameras 
any and all types of 35mm 
or larger. No Kodaks or 
Polaroids 205 S. Lamar 
629-2682 Steven Printing 
& Photography. tf 

Buffalo Barber Shop 
Cross Plains, Tex. 

Now Open 
Tuesday- Saturday 

7:30 a.m. to 6;00 p.m. 
Priced reduced on Regular 
Men's haricuts $1.75 Tues. 
special: Shaves- $1.00 Wed. 
Special: Shampoos and blow 
dry for Men, Women and 
children- 75 cents. 28 

Wanted- Information 
on any unsigned tapestry 
paintings done around 
1915- 1920 oil boom 
period. 629- 2413. TF 

1vU.n n Err 
jERVICEf  

HYDRAULIC 
JACKS 

New 12-TON 

'442' 
All Sizes 
Rebuilt 

TESCO T22 
1024 WALNUT 677-5060 

Fast, Dependable 

Fins Developing 

Palace Drug Store, 

Rising Star, Texas 

B&B BACKHOE SERVICE 
Box 671 

Gorman, Texas 
734-2370 

Frank Brinegar 
Backhoe, Dump truck, 
Ditcher. We do oil field 

Roustabout work 

BULLS 
.Register ed 	Polled, 

' Hereford bulls for sale. ,  
Henry Fry & Son. 442- 
1767. 
a a a 

PLUMBING 
PROBLEMS7all Hut-

chens Plumbing Co. for 
dependable and reliable 
service, reasonable rates. 
Water heaters also sold 
and installed. Licensed 
and Bonded. 

442- 3803 
LEWIS HUTCHENS 

• Rt. 2 Box 70 
Cisco, Texas 

(2- 27) 

DON'T LET ANYONE 
TELL YOU THAT YOU 
CAN'T AFFORD YOUR 
OWN HOME 

Let us show you how 
our financing plan can 
help you turn the dream 
of a spacious new all 
brick home into a living 
reality! 
Call K.B. Homes Collect 

817- 442- 3024 
Nights 442- 2070 

Desks, chairs, files, safes, 
tables, cash and carry. 
Save 20- 50 per cent. 
Large selection. 9- 5:30 
weekdays. Value City, 
1030 Butternut, Abilene. 
t- ti 	 • 

For Sale: fumiture,. 
fixtures, etc. complete for 
clothing business. Choice 
location. Long term lease. 
Low overhead. Or can be 
moved to new location. 
Excellent 	• business 
opportunity. 	Call 
817-442-1101 or 442-2709-, 
Cisco. 

4* 	.4 	4: 	* 
Prime commercial 

location in Eastland at 400 
E. Main St. Lease or sell 
7,000 sq. ft. building, 255 
ft. frontage. Ideal for 
many 	uses. 	Call 
214-424-2933. 	t8 

FOR SALE- 3 br home with 
kitchen, dining room, living 
room, and 2 bath 	, on 
corner lot with 2 extra large 
lots in addition. Plenty 
garden space, paper shell 
pecans, variety fruits, close 
in town. Near all churches. 

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom house 
on corner lot. LR-DR comb-
ination; kitchen and 1 bath. 
Several Pecan Trees. Close-
in. Ph. 643-2251, Jenkins 
Ins. 24-tfc 

FOR SALE: 80 acres. 
Practically all in coastal 
burmuda; good fences; 
barn; corrals; 5 irrigation 
wells; 3 bedroom house; 1/2  
minerals. 

Have 	prospective 
buyers for homes, farms 
and ranches. 

Jenkins Insurance 
Agency 

Rising Star, Tex. 
Phone 817- 643- 2251 48-. 

I will lease your land for 
oil or gas! Wanted to buy: 
shut in gas wells or gas 
production. 

John T. Yount 
Box 1703 

San Angelo, Tex. 76902 
915- 949- 1077 

•*****•••••-** -4.* .  
• Dr. 	* 
•  
• 

Ellis & Ellis •  
• Optometrist 
• * 
* 308 Citizens Nat'l Bank  * 
• Building 	* 
4"  Brownwood, Texas  * 

* 
GLASSES 41,‘ 

• * 
• CONTACT LENSES  * 
4 	Call 646- 8778 	* 
* or write, P.O. Box 149  * 

11121 *Ai * * * * 1.11-41 * 

We have qualified 
buyers for land in this 
area. If y ou are in-
terested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

3434 North 6th St. 
Office Phone 673- 2371. 

Alvin Hackfeld 692- 9597 
Venita Raymond 692-

5244 

CISCO LOCK 8 SOUND 

442-2293 
Bonded Locksmith 

P-31 
•	 

Men's and Boy's 
Insulated Coveralls 

$19.98 
Open Weekdays 8:30 to 
6:00 Sunday 1:00 to 5:00. 

B&H Trading Post 
311 N. Seaman 

t94 

FOR SALE: Good Coastal 
Bermuda Hay. Contact Jerry 
Winfrey at 643-6251. 25-tfc 

FOR SALE: 1964 Chevy Bus 
Camper- completely 	self 
contained- full kitchen and 
bath- carpeted 	stereo- 
sleeps seven. See at 604 S. 
Smith St. $4,500. t64 

FOR SALE: 1600 ft. 6 inch 
heavy wall aluminum pipe; 
1500 ft. 4 inch heavy wall 
aluminum pipe; 2 High 
Pressure 4 in. Pumps with 
IHC Power Unit; 1 Skid on 
Trailor; 
1.6 in. Lake or River Pump 

Power Take-off Drive; 40 
Risers with Rain Bird 
Sprinklers; Over 35 fittings. 
L's, Cross's, Valves. All in 
good shape. 
1-720 John Deere LP Gas 

Line Power and Take-off 
Tractor; Rollamatic; good 
tires and clean Tool Bar 
Planter and Cultivator in 
good shape. Ready To Go-
I M Farmall, good tires. 
Wide front-clean, starts good 
with factory L.P. Gas; 
1-706 IHC-3 pt. Hitch, L.P. 

Gas Line Poewr Take-Off; 
Wide Front. 
Ph. 823-1158 or 823-1183 

O.B. Cox or write P.O. Box 
551, Anson, Tex. 79501. 

PEACHES 
Smith Orchard in Rising 
Star. 26-tfc 

John Deere baler, New 
Holland swather, 730 
John Deere tractor, 26 
disc. Krouse one way, 
John Deere 10 disc. one 
way, Oliver grain drill and 
calf 	cradle. 	Hollis 

Williams 442-1933, 
Cisco. 

FOR SALE: Windmill phone 
817- 643- 5171. 29- 2t 

IRRIGATION EQUIPMENT 
A complete line of irrigation 
pumps-submersible. centri-
fugal. and turbine. Let us 
help you with your irrigation 
needs. Machine shop and 
parts for pump repair- Test 
Pit facilities. Also come take 
a look at our patented Ferti-
lizer-Herbicide-Chemical 
Applicator for chemical and 
fertilizer distribution through 
irrigation lines. Handling the 
pump needs of Central 
Texas, manufacturing the 
Crown Line of Submersible 
pumps. 50 GPM through 
1.000 GPM. 
CROWN PUMP 

CORPORATION Kimmell 
Irrigation Supply, Inc. 
Highway 16 Dc Leon. Texas 
Phone 81 7-89 3-2 49 5 or 
893-6266. 

HOMES 
FOR SALE 

15. Acres: All Electric 
house, Irrigation. Three 
tenthsmile West of Rising 

:Star; Huy. 36- owner, open 
House. Ph. 915- 692- 1917. 
Hit itp 

FOR SALE: Home for sale 
with 181 2 acres. Phone 817-
643- 5171. 29- 2tc 

FOR SALE: 6 room house: 1 
Bath; Complete cement 
storm cellar; Metal workshop 
with cement floor; Large 
lot -2 1/2 	Acre. 	Price: 
56.000.00. Ph. 643-6691 or 
can be seen by coming by 
Bibbys Creations. 29-2TC 

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom newly 
remodeled home, 604 
Avenue F. Cisco. New paint. 
lowered ceilings, new wiring. 
new cabinets and screens. 
must see to appreciate. 
Priced to sell $18,000. 
442-2012 or 442-3661. Also 
for sale 50 yards of used 
carpet, $1 per square foot. 
and 10 x 20 ft. Oriental 
Persian rug $2995. 

GARAGE 
SALES 

GARAGE SALE: Sale starts 
Wednesday 10:00 a.m. Next 
door to Post Office. 29-1te 

GARAGE SALE: First house 
past Dr. Carpenter's house 
on the right. Thursday and 
Friday July 20 and July 21st. 
Detta Webb. 29-1te 

White 	and 	Etna' 
authorized sewing 
machine dealer. Repair 
all kinds, by factory 
trained mechanic. DAVIS 
FABRICS. 610 W. 2nd. 
Cisco. p- tic 

NOTICE 
• • • 	• 	• 

• 

:FOR -SALE WANTED Phone : 
643-4141 

CUSTOM CUTTING and 
BALING HAY. Call R.L. 
(Bob) Rust 643-3137, 2lptfc 

HOME REPAIR 
SERVICE 

Carpentry-curbing 
fencing-painting 

no charge for estimates 
442-3136 or 442-1370 

IF YOU HEAR BUT 
DON'T UNDERSTAND 
BRING THIS AD IN FOR 
50.06 ALLOWANCE ON 

NEW HEARING AID. 
John W. Clinton 

Hearing Aid Specialist 
114 W. 8th 

Cisco 
442-2168 

Open Tuesday & 
Thursday 

DAVID FENTER 
LICENSED PLUMBER 
AND REMODELING 

CONTRACTOR 
647-1970 

Specializing in 
residential plumbing 

tf 

i Landscaping and yard 
work. We offer a complete 
yard care service for older 
homes or plan and plant 
trees and shrubs for new 
homes. For more informa-
tion call 442-1726 if no 
answer 442-1072. T-59 

FOR SALE: 10 Acres, 11/2  
miles east of Cross Plains, 
Hwy. 36. 

FOR SALE: Two Bay car 
wash, good pumps, new coin 
changer-$18,000.00. 

FOR SALE: 159 Acres--8 
miles from Rising Star on 
pavement. $400.00 acre, 
good hunting, level. 

MORGANS CABINET 
SHOP 

STAR ROUTE 
CARBON TEXAS 
Phone 643-6517 

CUSTOM BUILT 
CABINETS 

FOR SALE: On good corner 
lot 50 x 152--$1500.00. 

FOR SALE: House and two 
lots--$5,000.00. 

Z*=•=ve=•=•=0=1C11=0=4:0=•CI 

Do you really get a balanced 
diet? Let me tell you about 
Dr. Shaklee's Food Sup-
plements, Try Dr. Shaklee's 
Slim and Trim PLAN. 

We also carry natural food 
supplements, concentrated 
bio- degradable household 
cleaners, natural skin care 
products, toiletries and baby 
products. 

BARBARA JO KANADY 
SHAKLEE DISTRIBUTOR 
Phone 643- 3291 after 6 p.m. 

FOR SALE: 3 Bedroom 
stucco house; bath, cellar, 
garage workshop--$6,000.00. 

FOR SALE: One lot, 1/2  
acre--$2,500.00. 

Bob Shults Real Estate 
111 West College St. 

Rising Star, Texas 76471 
Day Phone: 817-643-1904 

Night Phone: 817-643-3434 
• 

• -* 4( * 	* 4 

4 

Rock house, N. Main on 100 
x 195 ft. Lot; garden space. 

Ed Williams 
Cesspool and Septic Tank 

Cleaning Service 
24 hour service. 

915-646-9333  
1707 Stewart Street 

Brownwood, Texas 76801 
5-13t 

---------- 

FOR SALE 

House, West College, 
adjacent to bank on 
on 77.4 x 208.3 Ft. Lot. 

Merle L. Joyce 
Executor 

Martin G. Joyce Estate 412 

1st St. 
Albany: 
Tel. 817-762-2164 

FOR SALE: Three bed room 
rock house, carpeted 
throughout. 32 acres, good 
fences and outbuilding. 
Located 3 miles from Rising 
Star, Texas. 

108 S. Anderson-3 BR, .LR, 
DR, Kitchen, I bath, large 
lot, 2 car garage, pecan 
trees. 
Have prospects for small 

acreage farms, houses and 
ranches. 
LOUIS MAYFIELD, 

BROKER 
Telephone: 817-643-4073 

19-tfc 

FOR SALE; 072 Buick 
Electra-4 door _disjoin hard 
top-beautiful .s-lizrde of 
green-Iliad: vinyl roix. 

1970 Olds. 98-4-door 
sedan 	loaded 	with 
locally owned. 
1969 Delta 88 4 door 

sedan-one owner car, 
excellent condition. 

1966 Plymoth Fury Sedan 4 
door. 
Call 629-2022 or 629-2083 in 

Eastland. 
We'll sell you a new car. 

any make or model, and save 
your some money! 

1111111•1111111•1111• 0  • •111••111•111111111111111M111•111111111 • • • 
■ 

FOR SALE: 1 flat bed' 
goosneck Trailer; 8 x 28, 
Triple axle; 4 wheel brakes, 
all lights. Price $2200.00. 31 2  
miles E. Hwy. 36 from RS. 
Phone 643- 4174. 29- tfc 

The Rising Star ■  • • 	• 
• 
• 
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 • • 
■ ■ 
■ 
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FOR SALE TRUCKS & 
TRAILERS 

• 

We have qualified buyers 
for land in this area. If you 
are interested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

• 104 North Main Street 
•  
• Rising Star, Texas 76471 

• H.V. O'Brien, Publisher 
• Evely . 1). . haw., Editor 
• Pi;ne 817- 643-  4141 
• SUIV4( RIPTION RATES: By mail in Eastland and 
• Adjoining Counties: $4.00 per year; in Texas, $5.00 per 
•  year; elsewhere is the U.S. and foreign counties, $8.00 • 
• per year. 
III 	Any e, coneous reflection upon the character, 
• standi,-..; or reputation of any person, firm or cor-
al porati,ifi which may appear ion the columns of this 
• newspaper will be gladly corrected upon being brought 
• 
• to the attention of the Editor. 

• \II advertising orders are accepted. 
• 1- nt.-red as second class postage at the Post Office in 
• Hisint.f, Star, Texas 76471. 
II  
• 

Puolished weekly. 
11 
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TEXAS PRESS 
MEMBER 	ASSOCIATION 	
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• 
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( FOR RENT 

5 Grain Trucks 
20 Truck Tractors 
4 Dump Trucks 
4 Dump Trailers 
5 Winch Trucks 
5 with Van bodies 
2 Grain Trailers 
8 Oil Field Floats 
4 27 to 40 Vans 

11 new Lobeds 
6 New Dropdecks 
6 New 40 to 45 Flats 
5 New Oil Field Trailers 

20 Others Trailers 
20 Others Trucks 

Johnson Trucks 
725- 6181 Cross Plains 

29- 3tc 

Jimmy Partin 
Insurance 

And Realty Co. 

FOR SALE: 2 piece vinyl 
living room suite; cook stove. 
Will sell at a bargain. Ph. 
643-4513. 29-ITC 

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom newly 
remodeled home, 604 
Avenue H, Cisco. New paint, 
lowered ceilings, new wiring, 
new cabinets and screens, 
must see to appreciate. 
Priced to sell $18,000. 
442-2012 or 442-3661. Also 
for sale 50 yards of used 
carpet. $1 per square foot, 
and 10 x 20 ft. Oriental 
Persian rug $1995.00. T59 

FOR SALE: 1966 Plymouth 
Fury III. 4 door sedan excel-
lent condition, good inside 
and out. good tires, don't use 
oil, good mileage 18 to 19 
miles per gallon. Call 629-
2083 or 629-2022. T-57 

BYING COINS 
TOP PRICES PAID 

Pre 1965 Silver, 40 
percent halves, silver 
dollars, 	gold, 	and 
collections. 

PRATTS COIN SHOP 
Abilene 

2155 S. 1st 
672- 6991 

:1434 North 6th St. 
Office Phone 673 - 2371 

NOTICE!!! 

Palace Drug Store will be open from 9 A.M. till 6 
P.M. for the week beginning July 17 thru Sat. 
July 22nd. This applies to this week ONLY. Will 
be open our regular hours beginning July 24th: 8 
A.M. till 6 P.M. Alvin Hackfeld 692 - 9697 

Venita Raymond 692 - 5244 



Scripture Thought 

OF THE WEEK 
For, uttering great swelling words of 
vanity, they entice in the lusts of the flesh, 
by lasciviousness, those who are just 
escaping from them that live in error; 
promising them liberty, while they 
themselves are bondservants of corrup-
tion; for of whom a man is overcome, of the 
same is he also brought into bondage. (2 
Peter 2:18,19) 
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Pharoah Pepi II of Egypt reigned for 90 years. 

WOMEN'S SUMMER 
SPORTSWEAR 

Popular Brands Many Styles! 
Reg. 
$9 

To 

$36 

=4501/2  

To 

Price 	$18 

WOMEN'S SHOES 
SUMMER STYLES 
Many Colors And Most Now  
Reg. All Sizes 

$8 	
4 

 Save 

MEN'S SHOE SALE! 
Many Summer Styles 

Discontinued Most All Sizes. 

$ 

Now 

1/4  
Reg. 

$26 

To To 

$28 
Off 

To 

50% $14 $37 

$195° 
To 

$2775  

Reg. 

$15 

To 

$24 

Double Knits 

One Group 
MEN'S SUMMER TROUSERS 

Now 

$975 
To 

$156°  

Save 

35% 

4, 

GIRLS SUMMER SPORTSWEAR 
Many Styles To Help Keep Cool 

Now 
Reg. 

$5 
To 

$20 

WOMEN'S SUMMER BLOUSES 
One Big Group Knits And Regular Now 

Styles. Save! 	
$4 $25° 50% 	To 

Off 	 $10 
1/2  

Reg. 
$8 

To 
$20 Price 

To 

$10 

Now 

Reg. 

sg 
$520 

MEN'S SUMMER SHIRTS 
Sport, Dress and Knits 

35% 
To 

$18 Off 

To 

$1 1 7°  

Reg. 
Reg. 
$8 
To 

$14 

Children's SANDALS 
Most All Sizes 

Now 
$45°  

To 
$8 

A 
V 
E 

$3 

Boy's Summer 

SHIRTS 4931  

35% To 

Off 	$520 

BANKAMERICARO 
EASTLAND - RANGER 
629.2321 647-1436 

EASTLAND COUNTY S FAMILY STORE 
FEATURING NATIONALLY ADVERTISED BRANDS 

OF MERCHANDISE 

Store Hours - 9 a.m. - 5 • .m. 
master charge 

Friends And Neighbors: 

We Want To Share With You Some 

Good News 
Come Hear 

Mornings: 

(Monday-Friday) 

7: 00 a.m. 

Evenings: 

(Monday-Friday) 

7: 30 p.m. 

Sunday: 

10: 30 a.m. 

Sunday: 

6: 00 p.m. 

e Peters 
Minister: Church Of Christ 

Shreveport, Louisiana 

July 16-21 

Church of Christ 
College And Miller - Hiway 36 

Rising Star 

Thursday, July 20, 1978 • become a highway for this 
vast army to march in 
Palestine. This is why the 
Lord said. Rev. 3:10, 
Because thou hast kept the 
word of my patience. I also 
will keep thee from the hour 
of temptation. which shall 
come upon all the world, to 
try them that dwell upon the 
earth. Behold, I come 
quickly: hold that fast which 
thou hast. that no man take 
thy crown. Verse 19, As 
many as I love. I rebuke and 
chasten: be zealous there-
fore, and repent. Behold. 1 
stand at the door, and knock: 
if any man hear my voice, 
and open the door. I will 
come in to him, and will sup 
with him, and he with me .  

came last week. 
The sick among us include 

Rusty Owen, in Hendrick 
Hospital after a serious 
motorcycle accident Monday 
eveining. Leonard Harris 
has had several bad days 
lately. Minna Harding is 
home still not feeling very 
good. Opal Brooks, mother of 
Arla Hill, is in the Kerrville 
Hospital Sid Peterson Room 
605 following. surgery. 
Emmett and Pauline 
Howard 'are home but still 
weak. J.W. Lee remains in 
critical condition. 

God bless you. Call us if we 
can serve in any way. 

Debbie Nunnally -- Gary Zoet 

And, isn't it strange how, 
here 44 years later, alcohol is 
the "drink of the man of 
distinction," and prohibition 
is remembered as the 
"scourge of American 
liberty" You've got to hand 
it to him- the devil has done 
a good selling job in 44 years. 

By the way, how do you 
feel about marijuana? Lots 
of folks argue that such 
should 	be 	legalized. 
Politicians are buying votes 
in I large quantities by such 
propaganda. 

Look back at the twenties 
and see if the arguments are 
not parallel. 

Was prohibition all that 
bad? Was the repal all that 
good? (end of quote). 

Christians need to stand 
firmly agianst all the "wilies 
of the devil" (Ephesians 
6:10- 18), and this includes 
his pack of lies about the 
fermented product of the 
vine (Proverbs 20:1; 23:3.1; 
Galatians 5:10- 21) 

Know the will of God and 
the great fruits of accepting 
His direction by regular 
Bible study. Join us, for 
Bible classes: on Sunday at 
9 : 30 a.m. and on Wednesday 
at 7:30 p.m., and for the 
Assemblies on Sunday at 
10:30 a.m. and 6 p.m. 

Our special Gospel effort 
continues through Friday 
evening and we urge you to 
attend. 	The 	morning 
meetings (30) minutes 
maximum- come as you 
are) are at 7 a.m. and the 
evening services are at 7:30. 
continue 

iriaTecouttham_ 
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Cox of 

Tyler were weekend guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Ray 
Cox. They attended funeral 
services for Mrs. Maude 
Buzbee Sunday at May. 

Conly Brewer of Fort 
Worth is spending the week 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
C. A. Alaborn. 

Marilyn and Randy Bibb 
have been visiting Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Bibb at 
Freeport. 

Church 
Of 

Christ  

Jesus was the best of 
everything that is called 
good. You would think all 
people would have loved 
Him. He loved everybody. 
He "went about doing 
good". He never once did 
anything but good. Could 
anybody hate Jesus? There 
were many who hated Him. 
He had more than the usual 
supply of dedicated enemies. 
"He is-despised and rejected 
of •men, a man of sorrows, 
and acquainted with grief.' 
There were those w ho tried 
who tried to trap Him. He 
was falsely accused. He was 
framed. There were those 
who said He was an illigiti-
mate child. Some called Him 
an imposter. To this day, 
more people believe the false 
accusations made against 
Him than those who don't. 
People plotted to destroy 
Him. He was hunted and 
chased from place to place 
like an animal and finally 
hanged on the cross with 
criminals as public enemy 
number 1. 

What should you do with 
your enemies? Do what 
Jesus did - love them. It was 
He who said. "Love your 
enemies, bless them that 
curse you, and do good to 
them that hate you, and pray 
for them which despitefully 
use you, and persecute you." 
Matthew 5:44. 
This is the divine formula. 

This is the only way to deal 
with your enemies. It takes a 
real Christian to do that. 
Isn't that what you want to 
be? 	• 

• INSPIRED... • 
"Many souls would be 

convicted of their sinfulness 
and converted.  through the 
impressions made upon them 
by our refusal to resent the 
evil actions of those 
controlled by satanic 
agencies." Medical 
Ministry, p. 254. 
Your friends the Adventists 

The Rev. Lloyd Coker of 
DeLeon who is a former 
pastor of the Methodist 
Church will conduct services 
Sunday, July 23rd at the 
First United Methodist 
Church in • the absence of 
Rev. Bill Easley. 

- - - 
Everette Harris has 

recently returned home from 
a five day stay in the 
Stephenville Hospital. He is 
recuperating nicely and 
expects t to be up and around 
soon. 

We join in sorrow Alta 
Agnew, following the death 
of her sister Roberta Clark in 
Ballinger recently, as well as 
the family of Mrs. Ada 
Folkner, whose passing 

Debbie Nunnally and Gary 
Zoet exchanged wedding 
vows in the Gazebo in 
Stevenson Park in Friends-
wood Saturday. July 8th, 
1978 at 7:30 p.m. 
Robert Humphries. 

minister of the Friendswood 
Church of Christ officiated at 
the ceremony. 
The bride was given in 

marriage by her father. 
Parents of the bride are Mr. 

and Mrs. Ray Nunally of 
Rising Star. 
The bridegroom is the son 

of Mr. and Mrs. Russell Zoet 
of Houston. 
Mrs. Bruce (Kay) Belk, 

sister of the bride was 
matron of honor. 
Best man was Paul Franks 

of Houston. 
A reception was hosted by 

the bride's parents in the 
community room at Steven- 

son Park. 
Following a short wedding 

trip the couple has taken up 
residence at 2400 McCue, 
Apt. 17 in Houston. 
Debbie is a 1973 graduate of 

Rising Star High School. She 
has attended San .lacinto 
Junior College, the Univer-
sity of Houston and the 
University of Texas Nursing 
School from which she will 
graduate in December with a 
B.S. Degree. She is presently 
employed by Universal 
Alloys of Houston. 
Gary is a graduate of Dobie 

High School in Houston. He 
attended Abilene Christian 
University and the University 
of Houston. He is employed 
by Corri gan's Jewelers of 
Houston. 
Mr. and Mrs. Russell Zoet, 

parents of the groom hosted 
a rehearsal dinner at their 
home. 

Commentary 

by Myrtle Owen 

The recent "Liquor 
Election" in Abilene and the 
subsequent 	controversy 
connected with it have 
brought to our attention once 
more a serious threat to our 
well- being John Davis, in 
an article which we 
reproduce today, asks 
pointedly: Was Prohibition 
All That Bad? 

He adds, "David Lusk 
recently published some 
very interesting information 
seldom revealed relative to 
those infamous prohibition 
days. Most of us have been 
led to believe that the 18th 
Amendment to the Con-
stitution in 1919 was all bad 
and that we would never 
again try such a disastrous 
bit of legislation. About all 
anyone can remember is Al 
Capone and bath tub gin, etc. 

What did the 18th 
Amendement really do? It 
closed 177,790 saloons and 
1,755 breweries. During the 
next ten years look what 
happened. Crime decreased 
54 percent. 2. The death rate 
due to liquor decreased 42 
percent. 3. Ninety- seven of 
the 	ninety- eight 	Keely 
Alcoholic Clinics closed. 4. 
Insanity decreased 66 per-
cent. All sixty Neel Cure 
Clinics closed down from 
lack of out patients afflicited 
with alcoholism. 

Then in 1933, prohibition 
was repealed. Here is what 
happened. 1. Drunkeness 
increased 35 percent. 2. The 
major St. Louis hospitals 
alone recorded a 400 percent 
increase 	in 	alcoholic 
patients. 
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NOTICE! 
DOCTOR SOHNS OFFICE 

WILL 	BE 	CLOSED % 
;THROUGH THE WEEK OF 
% % JULY 16 UNTIL JULY 23 %  

FOR ONE WEEK OF 
VACATION. 

k4rAr.rArArArAuorArArAnr.r.r.r.frm* 

Their slain also shall be cast 
out. and their stink shall 
come up out of their 
carcases. and the mountains 
shall be melted with their 
blood. And all the host of 
heaven shall be dissolved, 
and the heaven shall be 
rolled together as a scroll: 
and all their host shall fall 
down, as the leaf falleth 
off from the vine, and as a 
falling fig from the fig tree. 
For my sword shall be bathed 
in heaven: behold it shall 
come down upon Idumea, 
and upon the people of my 
curse, to judgment. Isa. 34:1-
5. God is speaking through 
the prophet Isaiah concern-
ing the last world Nuclear 
war which ends in Armaged-
don. It will be the most 
terrible slaughter of all the 
wars combined in the past 
history of the world. The war 
that the world is preparing 
for today, is described in 
Ezekiel 39:8-16. So great will 
be the slaughter it will take 
seven years to get rid of all 
the weapons of warfare used 
by the different nations, and 
seven months to bury the 
dead. So great will be the 
slaughter there will be a river 
of human blood that will flow 
into the valley of Jehosha-
phat, deep enouth that it will 
reach the horses bridle. It 
will flow on in to the valley of 
Megiddo, the whole country 
will be bathed in human 
blood, see Revelation 14:20. 

And the winepress was 
trodden without the city, and 
the blood came out of the 
winepress, even unto the 
horse bridles, by the space of 
a thousand and six hundred 
furlongs. It is the, Great and 
Dreadful day of the Lord, 
about which all the prophets 
of all the ages have 
prophesied. And their land 
shall be soaked with blood, 
and their dust made fat with 
fatness. For it is the day of 
the Lord's vengeance, and 
the year of recompences for 
the controversy of Zion. Isa. 
34:7,8. All the armies of the 
world deceived by Satan, and 
his evil spirits, will be 
gathered in the valley of 
Megiddo to the Battle of 
Armageddon and in the 
valley of Jehoshaphat. While 
this nuclear war will be world 
wide, the final stage of the 
world war will be fought in 
Jerusalem by armies and 
representatives from all 
nations of the world. This is 
where the Armies of the west 
which includes the United 
States, England, armies of 
the revived Roman Empire 
under the reign of the Anti-
christ, come to battle against 
the Northern Confederacy or 
Armies of Russia, and the 
Kinds of the East, which 
include Red China with her 
allies. The Euphrates river, 
which rises in the mountains 
of Turkey, and flows more 
than seventeen hundred 
miles to the Persian Gulf, has 
always been a natural barrier 
between the East and the 
West. But we see in Revela-
tion chapter sixteen, verse 
twelve, that it will be dry, 
that the way for the Kings of 
the East may be prepared. 
The dry river bed will 

WHAT TO DO WITH YOUR 
ENEMIES 

If you do anything 
worthwhile in this world. you 
will have many friends - but 
you will also have enemies in 
life. There will be many who 
will appreciate your noble 
efforts to make this old 
world of sin a little better 
place in which to live. But the 
moment you do something 
really outstanding you are 
sure to develop some strong 
enemies. You may not have 
many - but you will have 
some, I will guarantee that! 
We would all rather have 

friends. Friends are "on our 
side". Friends tend to over-
look our faults and mistakes. 
They tend to focus in on our 
excellencies - our best 
points. You appreciate their 
good judgment! But enemies 
do just the opposite. They 
see your worst points and 
tend to magnify the very 
worst in you. This is distress-
ing - and if you are not a 
Christian you will soon be 
tempted to retaliate and do 
the same thing to them as 
they are doing to you, and if 
you really work at it you can 
soon find yourself hating 
your enemy just as much as 
your enemy hates you. This 
is when real trouble starts -
trouble that can lead to loss 
of friends, financial disaster, 
open warfare, and even mur-
der. It happends every day. 
Sometimes it happens right 
in the home. You can become 
a hater; you can hate your 
fellow church member - even 
the local elder or church 
pastor. You can hate your 
husband, you can hate your 
wife, you can hate your 
brother, you can even hate 
God. 

the road of hate and 
retaliation is a road of 
distress and vexation. It is a 
hard road. Haters do feel 
moments of exhilaration 
when they are able to "put 
down" their enemies, but 
haters are not happy people. 
They are doomed. They will 
all be lost - every last one of 
them - if they do not turn to 
God. 

What can you do with your 
enemies? How can you get 
rid of them? The best way to 
get rid of your enemies is to 
turn them into friends. How-
ever, this is not always 
possible. Brother John 
McGee of Jay, Oklahoma, 
who is one of our faithful 
members and is 104 years 
old, has found a very special 
way to get rid of his enemies. 
He told me that he doesn't 
have an enemy in the world -
he's outlived them all! 

The great and Dreadful Day 
of the Lord, Come near, ye 
nations, to hear; and 
hearken, ye people: let the 
earth hear, and all that is 
therein: the world, and all 
things that come forth of it. 
For the indignation of the 
Lord is upon all nations, and 
his fury upon all their 
armies: he hath utterly 
destroyed them, he hath 
delivered to the slaughter. 



1 3 5 	12 	 CONCEPTUAL PLAN r1I1J1.1-1 	  
o 2 4 e 	 24 	25BEDS • 8416 GSF 

EASTLAND COUNTY JAIL 

ATTENTION • • 

Waitresses Wanted Full and Part Time 

Morning Shift and Evening Shift 

Apply In Person At Odom's Cafe. 

Cross Plains, Texas 

Cecil and Floyd Joyce, were 
honored on their birthdays 
with a picnic supper and 
sing-son in the Fellowship 

Thursday, July 20, 1978 
Hall of the First United 
Methodist Church, following 
the church services on Sun-
day evening. 4401meg Savings 

comes with a 
lifetime 

guarantee.99 
When you do business with Olney 

Savings you get a lifetime guarantee. 
We will pay you the highest 

interest rates on savings allowed by 
law. We will serve you better than 
anyone else. And, we will always 
bring you the newest financial 
programs. 

But we think "lifetime" means a 
whole lot more. 

We have a responsibility to you, 
our friend and customer. 

When you choose us as your 
financial institution, we must do 
everything in our power to earn your 
trust and confidence. These 
days that's tough! 

Olney Savings was founded on 
honesty and integrity. And we will 
uphold that principle. Always. 

Year after year, we're going to do 
what we say we'll do. We're going to 
be there when you need us. 

We'll never stop trying. We'll 
never stop doing. 

We want your business today 
and tomorrow. 

Come see us soon. Or call and 
we'll come see you. 'Cause it's the 
Olney way to save—with a 
lifetime guarantee. 
To us, people are worth a lot more 
than money. 

RANGER erN  EASTLAND 
SAVINGS N...wr SAVINGS 

H & W Developement H & W Realty 

Olden 
2 bedroom, 1 bath, large kitchen, huge living room, on 

large lot city water, gas and tv cable attached carport 
on payment. 

Lake Leon 
2 Bedroom, 1 bath trailer house, central heat and air, 

detached carport, T.V. antenna. Lease lot. Nice for 
weekends or permanent living. $8,500.00. 

3 bedroom, 13/4  baths with small glassed- in area ideal 
for office or plant room. Panelled and carpet. Total 
electric central, heat and air. Kitchen has built- ins. 
City and lake water, nice shade trees, some small fruit 
trees. Double garage. $40,000.00. 

Country living in city- Beautiful 3 bedroom brick 
home. Has 21/2  baths, beautiful kitchen with built- ins. 
Formal living and dining room, Wood- burning 
fireplace. Custom drapes and carpet throughout. Double 
garage. This is one of the most beautiful homes in 
Eastland. Financing Available. 

One of the nicest 2 bedroom, 1 bath home in Eastland. 
Nice kitchen with built- ins and inlaid on floor and in 
hall. Carpet in large living area and bedrooms. Central 
heat and air plus floor furnace. Large extra bedroom 
under separate roof at rear of house. Atached double 
carport. Beautiful shaded corner lot. Financing 
available. 
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meet 'a very tight budget." 
Another goal is to meet a 

move-in deadline of Oct. 29, 
1979. All utilities are readily 
available at this site. 
The design firm's tentative 

project time schedule calls 
for study and feasibility 
evaluation through July; 
approvals in August; fine 
design work to be completed 
by November; construction 
documentation by end of 
May, 1979; bidding in April; 
and construction to begin 
May 1 and completed by Oct. 
29. 
The present jail was 

constructed in 1897 and 
remodeled in 1934. 
Originally designed for a 
capacity of 24, and facility 
currently has a bunk capacity 
of 34. In a 1977 inspection by 
the Texas Commission on 
Jail Standards, the old 
facility meets or exceeds 124 
mandatory items, and does 
not meet 53 recommended 
items. 
The county has been 

granted tentative variances 
based on constructing a new 
jail by October, 1979, by 
Federal Judge Leo Brewster. 
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EXISTING BUILDING 

The Eastland County 
Commissioners Court has 
given tentative approval to a 
conceptual plan for a new 
25-bed jail to serve the 
county. 
The architectural firm of 

Boone and Pope has submit-
ted a proposal for jail 
facilities which would utilize 
land (20,000 square feet) 
owned by the county on the 
south half of a block between 
Mulberry, White and Lamar 
Sts. As presently drawn the 
new facilities would be 
immediately adjacent to the 
old jail, which is invisioned to 
become a historical site since 
its about the second-oldest 
structure in the county. 
The new facilities would 

provide some 8,416 square 
feet of space, and as it is 
presently drawn, would 
comply with the jail 
requirements, although this 
plan has not at this time been 
formally approved on the 
state level. 
Goal is set by the architects 

to "organize the facility's 
elements and activities into a 
physical plan maximizes staf-
fing and cost efficiencies -- 
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$•• • ARE YOU BURDENED WITH COSTLY 

PRESCRIPTIONS? 

YOU MAY SAVE AS MUCH AS SO% on 

some medicines by writing to this address for 

more information: 

Twenty-Five Attend Ex-Student Reunion Moore Family Meets In May 
NOTICE!! 

The Griggs Home 
Coming Will Not Be 

Held This  Year. 

Irene Starkey of Rising Star; 
Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Massin-
gale of Hico; Willie Hughes 
of Rising Star; Mr. and Mrs. 
B.A. Petzell of Brownwood; 
Marie Duggan and Gayland 
Duggan of Rising Star; Ethel 
Brown of Cross Plains; Alice 
and Everett Harris of Rising 
Star. 
This reunion was held in the 

community room at the First 
State Bank. 

Those attending the Brooks, 
Macedonia, Amith and 
Union Grove Ex-Student 
reunion Sunday, July 16, 
were as follows: Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Bennett of Brown-
wood; John and Layne 
Parker of Hico; Mr. and Mrs. 
Roy Lee of Big Spring; Mr. 
and Mrs. D.H. Proffitt of 
Hico; Clyde Starkey and 
family of Duncanville; John 
Starkey, Jay, Albert and 

dent; and Mrs. Horace L. 
Jones, reporter-secretary. 
The next reunion is 
scheduled for the fourth 
Sunday in June, 1979. 
Those attending came from 

Brownwood, May, Rising 
Star, Baird, Rockport, 
Midland, Lometa, San 
Angelo, Nebraska and 
Kansas City, Kan. 

The descendants of James 
M. and Sarah Jane Moore 
held their annual Moore 
cousins reunion at the May 
Community Center June 25. 
Those who attended 

listened to reports of trips 
taken around the country and 
world by members of the 
family. 
Officers were elected, and 

they are J.W. Moore, presi- 

Joyce Brothers Honored On Birthday 

ECONOMY DRUG, INC., P.O. Box 1063, 
Big Spring, Texas 79720 

Please include the name, strength and 

quantity of each medicine you are taking so 

ECONOMY DRUG, INC. can send you a price 
quotation as soon as possthle: 

216 S. Seaman 	----629-1702 	629-1703 
TRADEINS & RESALE Eastland 

503 Crestwood: This beautiful 3 bedroom brick home 
now under c construction. Has 2 baths, living room 
dining area and Woodburning Fireplace, double car 
garage on nice Large lot. One of the best locations in 
town. Don't wait, come in and pick your own colors. 
$48,500.00 with 5 percent down at present on Con-
ventional Financing. 

For Sale; 499 Crestwood under construction now this 3 
bedroom, 2 baths brick home with living room, dining 
room and kitchen with built- ins. Woodburning fireplace 
and double garage. Nice large lot in Ideal location. Time 
to come in and pick your colors $47,500.00 with 5 percent 
down on Conventional Financing. 

For Sale: 2 bedroom, living room, kitchen and 1 bath. 
Located on nice corner lot with carport at back and close 
to school. Some furniture $13,900.00. Gorman 

Very good commercial building site. Conveniently 
located on hiway No. 6. 290 foot frontage by 150 foot 
deep. 

DeLeon 

184 acres with 4 bedroom house, barns, pens all new 
fences, 5 irrigation wells. Tanks, 70 acres peanuts, 
balance in coastal owner will finance. 

Ranger 

3 bedroom, 1 bath, living and dining area. Lots of 
cabinet space in remodeled kitchen. Completely paneled 
and carpet. Detached carport. 421 Elm Street. $17,500.00 

D. D. McCLATCHY 
President Ray Winingar Broker 

WE HAVE MANY CHOICE BUILDING SITES 
COME IN AND PICK YOUR OWN PLAN 

J.C. Butler 629- 2149 
Ftamond Fox 629- 1140 
Larry Armstrong 629- 1683 

I it 

'flE Al TOP EQUAL HOUSING 
OPPORTUNITIES 



Tinactin 
Professional 
Treatment for 
Athlete's 
Foot 

Reg. sr9  

Sale 

'WY 

$2" 

PiTZEies ttetatanSIV  

• 99' 7 oz. 

Reg. 97" 

SAVE '1" 

Durango 

WESTERN BOOT 
No. 8964 

Reg. '32" SAVE '10" 

.....•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• ••••••••••••••••••••1 
k, CHEER 	and 	TIDE 	 ,,,kf VU. ALWA$ 6w THE EsEST LESS 	STRETCH ARMSTRONG OR MONSTER • 

Family 

Size 	

IBSOWS 

10 lb. 11 oz. 

Reg. '5" 

SAVE '2"1  

CRISCO 

Boys Blue No. B1008 

JOGGER 
Reg. '14" 	,54011, 

SAVE 
$500 

COMET 
21 oz. 

Girls White No. M506 

TENNIS SHOES 

Reg. $2' 64 se. win 
DETERGENT 

LAUNDRY 
SAVE 60' 

$219 

Mens Bib 

OVERALLS 
100% Cotton 

Dickies 
Reg. $13" 
SAVE $4 " 

$997 

Reg. '15" 

SAVE '4" 

Kenner 

COAST 

STRETCH 

Reg. 690  

PLASTIC 
PITCHER 

* 
• 

SAVE 	' t 

sur , 

2RCIte9.. Loma 
• 

87$!  
Collapsible *- 
FISH t 

BASKET ; 
SAVE 70' 
Reg. sr * 

I 371 

rofoom 

♦ 
♦ 

♦ 

7. • • 	• 

i

Miracle * 

MOTH* 
ems ! 

1 lb. 	♦ 
SAVE 201 

je* 9,rt 

• NOXEMA 
$143 

♦	 

• MUM TABLETS 

♦ 

84's 

Reg. '2" 

SAVE 70' 

Reg. $21,  

SAVE 70' 

10 oz. 

LET US FILL 
YOUR 
NEXT 

PRESCRIPTION 
Ph. 629-8211 

3 lb $169 

Sunshine Harvest 
SHAMPOO 

8 oz. 
Clairol Reg. 99' 

SAVE 40' 

CONDITIONER 
Short 8 Sassy 

Clairol 

Reg. '1" 
SAVE 50' ortt,  

S S y  t 

Flavorsaver 

Pharmacy 

Hwy. 80 East Eastland, Texas 

69' 

Rectangle 

PHARMACY 

• 

Hours 9 a.m. to 7 

Mickey Mouse 

Fry All 

DEEP FRYER 
Hamilton Beach 

Reg. '22" $4699 

SAVE se I 

p.m. 

GUM BALL 
BANK 

Hasbro 
Reg. $3" 

SAVE '1" 

22 LONG RIFLE 99$ 	Power Hite 
Box of SO 

$ 79 

ck  Mattel Bay  
Srd. COME 

171:?•°.L z±=1"li-, BACj 
• SAVE '5" 

Zebco 

Reg. sr 
• 
• 

Sale • 
• 
• 

$,75; 
Tylenol 100's 

	

for the millions 	 Y  
Common Cold/Ha F 	• 	• • • 

who 

	

forassh;ittnot 	Reg.s1" 	24's 
Triammicin • • 

•

Fast relief... 

	

Sale  $169 	

Sale 
$1 65 

Triaminian Tabiets 

Reg. '23" 
SAVE 5500  

$1897  

HELP SMOOTH AND SOFTEN SKIN 

P 

Reg. 
$557 

WITH is 

os un®  
AFTER TANNING LOTION 

• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

SAVE $16.2• 
• 

• 

$397• • 
• 

	 • PRESTONE • 
ow"' 	• 

Winter 

%dill Unmet. 

WIZ= \ SAVE 
Sice 

♦ Gel Reg. '3" 
♦ 

—1299  

SAVE '1" 202 REEL 	• 
Reg. '3" $299: 

PIE PLATE — Pyrex 91/2  in. 

• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• • • • • • • • • 
: • 	 Greg Bennett R. Ph. 	Keg. 
t••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••........................... 

DISCOUNT CENTER 
Thurs. July 20th Thru Sat;  July 22nd i 

629-1747 Eastland, Texas Hwy. 80 East 

Store Hours: 9 a.m.--7p.m. Monday thru Saturday 
Ladies Short Sleeve 

KNIT 
BLOUSES 

No. 1609 

♦ Mens 
i Short Sleeve 

SHIRTS 
Reg. '2" 

4 

• 

4\A 
• 

• 
fAvE 

• 
• 

• 

KNIT 

$197 

Lysol Basin, Tub, Tile 

CLEANER 
Reg. 51" 

SAVE 40' PRINGLES 
Twin Pk. 

00„k051cHARcoit $159  
10 lb. 

COMBO::  

33 
Zebco 

No. 3490 

ROASTING PAN 

♦ Wham-0 
• SAVE '2°° 

OE) 
V 

Reg '8" 

1 

'6" Reg. 57" SAVE '2" 
Blue 

Porcelain 
Ware 

by Cinsa 
$599 



Sun-Mon-rues One Show Only 

THE 
UMBER ONE 
SUSPENSE 
THRILLER! 

i'AETRO-COLOWYNALAYER ores enr s 

MARTIN [RICHMAN 	MICHAEL CRICHTON ,„ 
GENEVIEVE BUJOLD . MICHAEL DOUGLAS -COMA 

ELIZABETH ASHLEY' RIP TORN and RICHARD VVIOVARK 
Screenpiay by 	 Besed an the novel Dy Muse 

MICHAEL CRICHTON-ROBIN COOK-JERRY GOLDSMITH 
flrecred 5y 	 Produced by 	 PANAVISION' METROCOLOP  
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MGM i t.t• TUnitedc  .  Artistsan  
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Sun-Mon-Tues. 8:00 P.M. Only 

Bobby Couldn't make it... 
till he went rthrt-1?-11 

:OLOR.  
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r  
Oil News 

Thursday, 
The planned 3,200 foot 

venture is located on a 181 
acre lease four miles north of 
Rising Star. 
It spots 467 feet from the 

south and east lines of 
Section 21, James Jett 
Survey, A-333. 
Walsh & Tram Petroleum 

Corp. of Tyler will drill No. 1 
M.J. Byrd in the Grosvenor 
(Ellenburger) Field in Brown 
County. 
The planned 3.000 foot 

venture is located on a 101 
acre lease one-half mile 
north of Grosvenor. 
It spots 2.314 feet from the 

south and 1.263feet from the 
east lines of Section 36. 
HT&B Survey. 
Sioux Natural Gas Corp. 

staked two regular field loca-
tions in the county. Each is 

Stenholm Endorsed By Burleson 
July 20, 1978 

gained a new well. 
The oiler is Sentinel 

Petroleum Co. No. 1-B 
Autry, spotting 467 feet from 
the south and 1,787 feet from 
the west lines of Section 27, 
Block 3, H&TC Survey, 
A-272. 
Daily potential was 152 

barrels of 42 gravity oil, 
flowing through a 16-64-inch 
choke with 1,260 pounds 
casing and 335 pounds 
tubing pressures. 
Production is from 

perforations at 3.101-13 feet. 
Operator set the 41/2  inch 

casing at 3,740 feet, and the 
hole is bottomed at 3.763 
feet. 
Louisiana Crude Oil & Gas 

Co. Inc. of New Orleans will 
drill No. 1 Union Life in the 
Penn (Ranger) Field. 

Arias M. Sikes of 
Brownwood will drill No. 5 
Bryan Bush in Brown County 
Regular Field. 
The planned 1,200 foot 

venture is located on a 77 
acre lease 15 miles northwest 
of Brownwood. 
t spots 3,555 feet from the 

north and 1,345 feet front' the 
west lines of James Kinney 
Survey 624. 
Richard Gray Inc. of San 

Angelo completed No. 1 
Brookesmith Gridiron in the 
regular field on Brookesmith 

townsite. 
Location is 852 feet from the 

southwest and 325 feet from 
the northwest lines of E.R. 
Meyers Survey 202. 
Absolute, open flow was 

320,000 cubic feet of dry gas 
daily from perforations at 
1,149-54 feet. 
Operator set the 41/2  inch 

casing at 1,218 feet, and the 
hole is bottomed at 1,237 
feet. 
Mangum, West (3,100) 

Field four miles southeast of 
Cisco in Eastland County has 

slated for 1,200 feet. 
No. 2 P.I. Matson will be 

drilled on a 240-acre lease 10 
miles southeast of Cross 
Plains. 
Drillsite is "50 feet from the 

north and 150 feet from the 
cast lines of Section 15". 
ETRR Survey. 
The firm's No. 2 R.A. 

Horton spots 11 miles south-
east of Cross Plains on a 
10-acre lease. 
Site is 150 feet from the 

north and 400 feet from the 
west lines of E. Brooks 
Survey, A-159'. 
Texfel Petroleum Corp. of 

Abilene will drill No. 1-4-11 
Fee as an Eastland County 
wildcat three miles north of 
Eastland. 
The planned 4,100 foot try 

is located on a 40 acre lease. 
It spots 2,173 feet from the 

north and 467 feet from the 
west lines of Section 11, 
Block 4. H&TC Survey. 

political race. There are a 
little over 1,000 people 
involved in our behalf. That's 
why we wont he runoff, and 
that is why we will win in 
November." 
"Our campaign philosophy 

will remain the same as it has 
from the beginning, Sten-
holm continued. "We still • 
plan to run hard. talk about 
the issues, be sincere, and 
meet as many people as 
possible. 
"Come next January, we 

will attempt to fill Omar's 
shoes, but we'll have 'to wear 
out another pair doing it," 
Stenholm said as he praised 
Burleson. 
"Convincing 217 of my 

fellow Congressman to vote 
the way we think in the 17th 
Dist. will be one of my 
toughest jobs. The way you 
feel we ought to vote on the 
issues that come before 
Congress is the way I will 
have to convince the other 
217." 

Jerry E. Wylie Oil Drilling 
Co. of Abilene spotted No. 2 
Arnold Butler in the Duster, 
Northeast (2,750 Marble 
Falls) Field in Comanche 
County. 

Location is three miles 
south of Gorman, spotting 
1,310 feet from the north and 
2,310 feet from the west lines 
of Section 44, H&TC Survey. 

The lease is composed of 
160 acres. 

L. M. Young of Abilene will 
drill No. 1 D. Tarver as a 
wildcat 14 miles south of 
Cisco. 

They planned 3,680 foot 
venture is located on an 80 
acre lease. 

It spots 2,310 feet from the 
north and 990 feet from the 
west lines of Section 57, 
Block 3, H&TC Survey. 

Wyde Oil Co. of Odessa will 
drill No. 1 Gray as a 
proposed 3,100 foot wildcat in 
Eastland County. 

Location is three miles 
northwest of Rising Star on a 
100 acre lease. 

It spots 1,200 feet from the 
south and 467 feet from the 
east lines of the southwest 
quarter o of Section 24, Block 
2, ETRR Survey. 

Charles Stenholm recieved 
a public endorsemwnt from 
retiring, veteran Cong. Omar 
Burleson recently in Mineral 
Wells. The endorsement 
came after the two had 
appeared together several 
times.  during Stenholm's 
recent campaigning. 
Stenholm is the Democratic 

nominee to "fill the shoes" 
of Burleson as the 17th 
District's new Congressman. 
"I am so glad you have 

selected as my successor 
Charles Stenholm," Burle-
son opened his remarks. He 
closed his introduction of 
Stenholm by stating, "I take 
great pride in presenting for 
you and with you Charles 
Stenholm, our next Congres-
sman." 
Burleson was on hand for 

his public endorsement at a 
Stenholm Appreciation Get-
Together/Fish Fry. The 
more than 300 persons 
braving the 106 degree 
temperature to attend the 
gathering 	gave 	both 
Burleson and Stenholm 
standing ovations as they 
each approached the plat-
form. Stenholm was 
interrupted seven times with 
applause 	from 	his 
supporters. 
Burleson, who is retiring 

after 32 years of representing 
the 17th District in Congress, 
noted that Stenholm would 
be going to Congress at 
about the same aae as he 

did. "But I think he is better 
qualified. He is one of the 
finest young men I have 
known, and I have known 
him about all of his life. He's 
(Stenholm) well qualified and 
equipped to go. Better than 
I. I think you are going to 
have better representation. I 
thank he is a man who can 
meet the challenges of the 
time." 
Further praising Stenholm. 

Burleson said, "Charlie will 
go to Washington and know 
which way the citizens of this 
great country are going and 
if they are going in the right 
direction. He will be there 
leading. I have the confi-
dence in him. You'll make no 
mistake by wholeheartdly 
supporting this man. That is 
one way we can know that 
our country is in the best 
hands possible," Burleson 
concluded. 
Stenholm opened his 

remarks by noting that "It's 
quite 	an 	humbling 
experience for a man of 39 to 
be introduced by a man 
(Burleson) who has served 
this country so well for 32 
years." 
Stenholm continued by 

telling his supporters, "The 
reason I am here today is . 
because of the people, like 
yourselves here tonight, in 
the entire 17th District. 
People are essential in a 
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CITIZEN REALTY 

	

z 	 z 
820 W. MAIN 	 EASTLAND, TEXAS 76448 	\ 

\ 
EASTLAND 	 1 

1205 Ave. F Frame and in good condition has 1300 sq. 

	

.605 S. Marsh, New On Market, Brick home in Good 	ft. living area, 3 bedroom. carpet lot size 50 x 140. 

	

% 	condition, has 1000 sq. ft. living area, 3 bedroom, 1 1/2 	Vacant, $22,000. Call for details on financing. 

	

6 	bath, Lot size 75 x 112 call for more details on financing.  
Total price $32,000.00  

300 E. 18th Need A Starter, get started right with this 2 k 

	

907 S. Halbryan Attractive 2 bedroom frame, 1 bath, 	br, 1 bath, w- attached garage, frame home! $6,000. % 

	

g 	large family room; good shade trees on property, rear 	Call for details on financing. 

i entry with double carport. $23,900.00 
304 E. 18th Look! It has what you need for a low price, 2 

	

k 	716 S. Dixie Beautiful new home, just now being 	3 br., frame, 13 4 baths, combination LR and dining area g 

	

1 0 
 completed has 1417 sq. ft living area rear entry, double 	with attached double carport, also; storm celler, work 

car garage attached. $41,950. $2,100 down payment on - 	shop w- electricty $8,000. Call for details on financing. q 

	

\ 	conventional loan; FHA and VA financing available. 

	

405 Briarwood, Crestwood Addition, beautiful new 	
Looking for a good buy in Cisco? We have 9 lots  

available now $500. each call for more details. 	\ 

	

brick "Coronado" Plan Home- 3 bedrooms, 2 full bahts, 	 \ 

	

44 	family room has wood burning fireplace, island range 
RANGER  

	

plus built- ins makes a lovely kitchen, cen., heat and 	 \ 
air, utility room, carpet throughout, 2 car attached 

	

garage. $41,950.; $2,100, down payment on conventional 	308 S. Oak Big 4 " 	- ' •h home on 4 lots with 

i loan. Immediate occupancy. 
pe 

fruit trees. This I SOLD  partially remodeled. 
This is a su r bu  ily on a tight budget- 

	

402 Briarwood Built for Entertaining- Spacious 3 	$16,000. Call for ctelaus on nnancing. 	 0 
\ bedroom floor plan with huge roof covered patio off 

	

garden kitchen. Formal dining room. Large master 	 1 
bedroom with patio door. Full masonry woodburning 

good buy for $9,0 
308 Cherry 3 be SOLD ,me on 2 lots-Areal 

fireplace. Wet bar, Must see to appreciate. $57,400 $2900 
down payment with conventional financing. 	 1 103 Travis St. 3 bedroom, 1 bath, 1 car garage brick 6 

	

% 	709 Connellee- 2 year old brick home in mint con- 	home, living room and nice den, large corner lot with 	i 

	

dition. 3 bedroom, 1 3/4  bath, 1 car garage, beautiful 	garden spot, good at $33,000. 
C carpet throughout. Built- in range and dishwasher. 

	

Central air and heat. Buy equity and assume present 	917 Pershing Good 2 bedroom frame home. A good buy 

	

FHA Loan. Vacant and ready for you. Total Sales Price 	for $6,500. 
28,200. 

1200 Westland Nice 3 bedroom, 11/2  bath, 1 car garage. 

	

601 Halbryan- New listing- 2 bedroom, 13/4  bath, 1 car 	Central heat at 	 air. Built- in range, \ 

	

garage brick home. Wood burning fireplace in paneled 	carpet, d drape OLD beautiful Oakhill Sub- 4 

	

living room, Dining room plus den and utility room. 	division. New I 	 tan or buy equity and 

	

4 	Beautiful kitchen with built- ins in range and dish- 	assume existing FHA loan payment of $184.23 monthly % 

	

% washer, patio, redwood fenced, central heat and 	call today for details. 
b 

	

evaporative air. You must see this beautiful home to 	 1 

	

% 	appreciate it. $27,500. 900. 	 101 Gordon Just ---- ' ' - 	droom home on pretty 6 
lot and privacy lso 	paint inside and out. g 

	

6 	_Iwo W. Moss- Beautiful custom brick home located 	Some new floor ti! 	LD imediate possession on g 

	

g 	on over one whole city block of land, 3 spacious 	approved $14,500. oAsicIll U.Own r HA or No down to Vets. i 0 bedroom, 21/2  baths, 2 car garage, woodburning 
fireplace, built- ins in custom kitchen. Formal living 

	

and dining room, carpet throughout. Custom drapes, too 	
..1211 Lamar Primp *--4---1  ' • $24,700 on this im- k 

3 	many amenities to list in ad. Country living on secluded 	conditioning. Built 
maculate 2 bedrooSOLD Central heat and air k  

1 oven, drapes, clean \ 

	

hilltop location overlooking Eastland $79,800. Financing 	and ready for you r.,, Anuvc in. 4)750. down FHA or no 
1 available. 	 down payment to Vets.  
S 

	

% bath home with garage apt., large kitchen, custom 	One bath, living 
715 Cypress Go( soLD  tome in good location. 1 

; room, kitchen plus 
4 	600 S. Seaman NEW LISTING Beautiful 3 bedroom, 1 3/4  

	

cabinets, built- ins ranger, dish washer, big living 	woodburning fire. 	 b 

	

room, woodburning fireplace, formal dining room, 	 1 

	

custom drapes, carpet thru out on big corner lot. Buy 	910 Senclair Good 2 bedroom home in good location. 6 
equity and assume VA loan. 	 One bath, living room, dining room, kitchen plus 

woodburning fireplace. 
CISCO 	 is 

LAKE LEON  
% 	1202 W. 13th Comp' ' 	d3 bedroom home in 	 \ 

	

1

good location. New SOLDd out. Insulated and 	Beautiful lake home on one of the best lake front 3 
remodeled to meet 

	

	$20,250. $650. down 	locations. Beautifully landscaped back yard to water 3 
% FHA or no down payment to Veterans. 	 dock and boat ramp. Home has custom cabinets, 4 

woodburning fireplace and huge covered patio. 

1 	 1 

	

1308 W. 11th New Iktina in aftni4 area, 3 bedroom, 1'2 	
d New Listing- Custom built Lake home on beautiful 
deeded lake front lot, 2 big bedrooms, 2 baths, oversized bath, 2 car garage situ)

wilt ins. Central air 
excellent condition. 

- 	
2 car garage with lots of storage spacious kitchen with 4 Pretty carpet. Nic(  
plenty of cabinets, woodburning fireplace. Built- in 

	

and heat, custom L....tYy,,,,,,, on new loan or buy 	range and dishwasher. Gardens, city water, gas and equity and assume present FHA loan. 

b 	
electricity. 2 boat house. Basement for game room or 0 
extra bedroom. Too many extras to list in ad. $75.000. ; 
financing available. 

3 	601 W. 6th remade 	 rge 4 bedroom new 
4 carpet and freshly p 

SOLD 
good buy $16700.00,  

% $550.00 down FHA ( 	 ). 
ACREAGE \ 

\ 

	

208 W. 5th Beautiful Hillside Home with Heavenly 	 1 
Breeze on the front porch will please you very much. 

Nimrod- 40 acres (love and coastal) $500 per acre 	% 
 

0 Lovely floor plan; 2 large bedrooms, good storage, 1 

	

\ bath, stove and dishwasher are kitchen features with 2 	Morton Valley- 492 acres well improved $425. per acre. \ 

	

\ car attached garage. $19,500. Call for details on finan- 	 \ 
cing. 	 South of Cisco- 80 acres improved $500 per acre. 	a 

1 
4 	404 W. 1 i th Super Home! Beautiful Carpet to greet you 	Southwest of Cisco- 77 acres with 2 bedroom home % 

	

in this 2 br, 1 bath, green kitchen w- dishwasher, has 	$38,000. 	 b % single car garage w- large work area, fenced in back N yard. $24,000. Call for details on financing. 	 Lake Leon Rd.- 4,504 acres.- Good building site $4500. % 

b Call today for details on financing.  1 	 . Bill Griffith- 647- 1635 % Wayne Durham- 629- 8212 
6 Carol Senkel- 629- 1269 	 C. Angy Fowler, Broker 	 Teens McMurry- 442- 2459 2 

C Kenny Cogburn- 629- 2348 	 629- 8087 	 Leonard Richey 647- 3788 i 

i Barbara Love- 647- 1914 

b NOTICE  
\ 
\ 	 WE CAN TRADE FOR YOUR EQUITY IN YOUR PRESENT HOME ON MOST OF  
\ 	 THE ABOVE LISTINGS. CALL TODAY FOR DETAILS. 	 \ 
\ 	 \ z 	arizeNs 
z . 	 . . 	REAUY z 

Urgent I We Need Listings !! 
Veterans No Down Payment 

ift i  .%k  
z 	 629-1769 I L. 

It 
1 	 , 

EQUAL HOUSING 	 "We Sell Eastland County" 	 p€A,'Ori' 
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Fri. and Sat. Only 8:00 P.M. 
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Sipe Springs 
News 

131 MRS. JACK MILLWEF 
Lawn — 

Mr. Judson Poteet of 
Muskogee, Oklahoma, his 
son of Garland and grandson 
of Irvin visited N.L. 
Leopards saturday. 

Mr. Herman Boswell of 
Arlington spent saturday 
night with his mother, Ruby 
Boswell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Covie 
Weaver and sons and Tod 
Lewis of Garland spent last 
weekend with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. T. A. Weaver. 
Their grandsons, Todd and 
David stayed over for a 
couple week vacation. 

Mr. Jack McKeehan of 
Brownwood spent sunday 
visiting his brothers the John 
and Quill McKeehans. 

Mr. and Mrs. G. T. Whittle 
spent Sunday in San Angelod 
and visited their friends Mr. 
and Mrs. Carson Seals. 

Mr. Jack Millwee and 
family had as their guest this 
week her sister and families, 
Mr. and Mrs. Windell Hines 
of Delta, Colorado and Mr. 
and Mrs. Michael Leslie of 
DeLeon. 

BIRTHDAYS 
JULY 19 

Richard Watson 
Betty Thornton 
JULY 20 
Helen Jackson 
Mary Jo Butler 
Paris Hardy 
JULY 21 
Mildred Childers 
Randell White Edge 
JULY 22 
M.J. Dukes 
Nellie Maynard 
Terry Byrd 
Mabel Ralston 
Gene Christian 
JULY 23 
Beulah Cook 
Gwen Dale Winfrey 
JULY 24 
E.E. Winfrey 
Eddie Murphy 
JULY 25 
Billy Morrison 
Melanie Ratliff 

The light Toad 

Why is it that the fellow 
who has an hour to kill 
always spends it with some-
one who doesn't? 

t-t. dog teaches a child 
fidelity, perseverance, and to 
turn around three times 
before lying down. 

Nothing depreciates your 
car faster than the neighbors 
buying a new one. 

Patience: the ability to idle 
your motor when you feel like 
stripping your gears. 
Some folks speak from 

experience. Others, from 
experience, don't speak. 
Speak to us at Bray's in 

Eastland and Ranger. We've 
loads of experience with 
growing families and clothes 
that keep their fit. 

use 

'Ds 

Whirlpool 

17,000 BTU/Hr. 
• Deluxe Front • 3-speed fan • Energy 
Saving Options (intermittent fan and 
adjustable thermostat) • 4-way air di-
rection • 2-way air changer control 
(Exhaust Fresh air) • Slide-out Chas-
sis for faster installation • COMFORT 
GUARD' control helps maintain com-
fort level you select 

Model ADF 1704 

it 

save 20-25% 
Spring and Summer 
CLEARANCE  

M. L Terrell 

mown Pot Estathons629-1725 
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 

8 acres located on Interstate 20 near Ranger. $25,000.00 
7 unit Motel with 2 bedroom living quarters, carpet, 

built- ins and 12 x 60' mobil home in Eastland. 
7 unit Motel with 3 bedroom, 2 bath home, new carpet, 

in good repair. Located in Cisco. 
Large lot in Olden with fruit trees, on service road of I- 

20. $4,000.00 
HOMES 

In Eastland 
3 bedroom, 2 bath home that needs some completion, 

with approximately 3 acres. 
2 bedroom, 12 x 60's Mobil home on approximately 3/4  

acres. Several outbuildings. $8,000.00. 
2 bedroom, 1 bath with carpet, paneling in nice location. 

$17,000.00 
Large 2 bedroom, 1 bath home that is paneled with 

carpet and fireplace. A nice place. $15,400.00 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home on East Sadosa. $15,000.00 
2 or 3 bedroom home with sleeping porch, carpet, some 

paneling. $11,000.00 
3 bedroom home with 4 lots and 25 x 100 building. 

$22,000.00 
3 bedroom, 1 1/2  bath home with carpet, central air and 

heat, double garage, in nice location. $28,500.00 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home on 3 lots. Needs some repair but 

would make a real nice place. $13,000.00 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home with 3 lots. It has been partially 

remodeled. 
3 bedroom, 1 bath home that has been completely 

remodeled including carpet throughout_ Situated on three 
small lots. $17,000.00 

3 bedroom, 11/2  bath home with carpet and paneling. 
Also 2 smaller rent houses. This can all be bought for 
$15,500.00 

3 bedroom, 3 bath, living room, den, gameroom or 4th 
bedroom, with carpet, paneling. A nice place. $35,000.00 
Other locations: 

2 bedroom, 2 bath frame home, total electric, double 
garage, with large lot. Located at Lake Leon. $65,000.00 
• 2 bedroom, frame home on 12 lots. Has good metal 
barn, water well, all city utilities. Country living but still 
close to town. Located in Cisco. $31,500.00 

2 bedroom, 1 bath located in Ranger with 2 car gargage, 
pecan trees. $16,500.00 

Extra nice home at Lake Leon with 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 
fireplace, carpet, and many extras. Approx. 2350 square 
feet. $72,000.00 

3 bedroom, 1 bath home with carpet in Cisco 
3 bedroom, 1 bath home with carpet and corner lot in 

Cisco 
3 bedroom, 1 bath home with carpet and corner lot in 

Cisco 
4 bedroom, 11/2  bath two- story home with den, carpet, 

paneling, storage building, with approx. 21/2  lots. Located 
in Ranger. $32,500.00 

A nice 2 bedroom home on approx. 2 acres in Olden. 
Water well, and city water available. Several out-
buildings. Priced at only $22,500.00 

SMALL ACREAGE 

40 Acres 7 miles West of Carbon, all love grass and 
coastal, and good fences. Some minerals. $21,500.00 

41 acres near Lake Leon on pavement with city water 
available. No improvements. 

75 acres 3 miles West of Union Station on pavement. Has 
fair house with water well. $35,000.00 

80 acres Northwest of Gorman, some cultivation and 
some peanut allotment. One- half minerals. $400 per 
acre. 

30 acres tracts near Cisco on Interstate 20. Will Gi. 
2 to 5 acres tract near Lake Leon with all utilities 

available. Ideal building sites. 
FARMS AND RANCHES 

125 acres 5 miles Northwest of Gorman with 53 acres 
cultivation, 53 acres peanuts balance in pasture that has 
been cleared and reseeded in bluestem. $600 per acre. 

650 acres on Sabanna River with lots of pecan trees and 
some c cultivation. Terms can be arranged. $325 per acre. 

150 acres near Carbon 1 mile off pavement with 60 acres 
cultivation, 2 tanks, fair fences, good water well. Good 
deer hunting and fishing. Has 2 bedroom frame house. 
$320 per acre. 

612 acres located near Lake Leon with large 2 bedroom 
home, on pavement with 174 acres cultivation, good 
fences, good pens and barn. $375 per acre. 

395 acres located on Ranger- Morton Valley highway 
with good fences, some coastal and love grass. $385 per 
acre. 

154 acres Southwest of Carbon with 4 tanks, 100 acres of 
coastal, good barn, and older house. Will take 29 percent 
down and carry 10 years. $450 per acre. 

546 acres Northwest of Eastland with 34  mile highway 
frontage, 9 tanks, water well, city water, 180 acres 
cultivation and a 5 room house with fireplace. $325 per 
acre. 

415 acres Southwest of Ranger with deer and turkey. On 
Colony Creek. $300 per acre. 

160 acres South of Cisco with highway frontage and 
good fences. 

160 acres Southeast of Ranger with deer and one- half 
minerals. $325 per acre 

(Farms and Ranches Cont'd) 
142 acres Northwest of Ranger with 55 acres peanuts 

and 6 irrigation wells. $55,000.00 
152 acres near Eastland with city water, electricity and 

telephone available. Located on Interstate 20. Will sell all 
or will subdivide. 

146 acres near Lake Leon with some cultivation, on 
pavement and one- half minerals. Will sell all or will 
subdivide. 

250 acres North of Ranger that is good deer hunting 
country. Some minerals. $250 per acre. 

210 acres close to Morton Valley, on pavement with city 
water, good fences and 60 acres cultivation. Terms can be 
arranged. $315 per acre. 

318 acres 1 mile South of Harpersville, with 3 tanks, no 
cultivation, good fences, and no minerals. 25 percent 
down, 81/2  with balance in 20 years. $265 per acre. 

We Have Other Listings 
Large and Small 

All Listings Will be Appreciated 

Office Phone 629-1725 
Hlway 80 East 
Eastland, Texas 76448 

M.L. Terrell 
Broker 
Home 629-2443 

Pat Maynard 
Associate 
Home 629-8063 

Helen Bradford 
Associate 
Office 647-3230 
Home 647-1923 

Debbie 	and 	John 
McKeehan of Abilene are 
with their grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Quill McKeehan 
while mother, Mrs. Charles 
McKeehan attends her sister 
and nephew's funeral, Janice 
Clark and son, Eric of Dallas, 
in Topeka, Kansas, friday 
who were fatally injured in a 
car collision Dallas. Our 
sympathy goes out to Mrs. 
Clarks family and relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Strube 
and Mr. and Mrs. Carl Wash-
burn spent Sunday in 
Wea therf ord. 

Mrs. Ruby Boswell is home 
from Scott and White 
hospital, where she received 
a good report. She also 
visited with her sons in 
Arlington. 

Mrs. Carl Washburn spent 
last weekend with her sister, 
Mrs. Ruby Fay Higgans in 
Cross Plains. 

Annual 4-County Home Demonstration Camp July 19th 
Demonstration Camp this 
coming Wednesday, July 
19th in Brownwood. The 
day's activities will be in the 

Home Demonstration Club 
members from Eastland 
County will be participating 
in the annual 4-County Home 

placing first and advancing 
to District competition were 
Debbie Burnett, clothing; Al 
West, sheep; Chris Hallum, 
agriculture; Marek Fountain, 
dairy; Terry Burnett, 
automotive; Bobby Burnett, 
vetinary science; Paul 
Chapman, photography; and 
Lynne Whiteaker, Santa Fe. 
Other placing in the junior 

division were Crissy Moore, 
second, clothing; Kenneth 
Williams, third, sheep; Patti 
Williams, fourth, sheep; 
Scott Perkins, white robbon, 
dog care and training; 
Alvaloy Sonnenburg, white 
ribbon; and Doug Malone, 
white ribbon. 
Seniors placing first and 

going to District are John 
Chapman, public speaking; 
Kenny Hignight, rabbits; 
Matt Muckleroy, swine; 
Robert Hallum, beef; Johnny 
Williams, sheep; Steve 
Storey, conservation of 
natural resources; Doyle 
Hallum, agriculture; Janet 
Nelson, achievement; Julie 
Haynes, Santa Fe; and Karla 
Keese, horse. Other seniors 
were Greg Roach, sheep, 
white ribbon. 
These boys and girls all 

worked hard in getting these 
record books together. 

Thursday, 

July 20, 1978 

Brown County 

Youths Take 

Honors 

Brown County 4-H Record 
Books were judged Tuesday. 
A total of 25 record books 
were entered in 16 different 
categories. 
In the junior division those 

Adam's Street Community 
Center, 511 E. Adams Street 
in Brownwood. Registration 
is from 9:30 to 10 a.m. 
The day will be filled with 

craft demonstration, guest 
speakers, skit and sing 
songs, and conclude with 
business meeting at 2:30 
p.m. 
The 1978 Fall Fashion Fore-

cast will include a beautiful 
array of colors, textures, - 
and styles. The newest items 
in styles this fall will include: 
SLIMMING DOWN - slim 
skirts, nipped in waisted 
coats, broad shoulders taper-
ing to hem. 
SPENCER JACKET - the 
newest look with trimming of 
the waist in a short cropped 
jacket. Worn with the soft 
slimmer skirt or tapered 
pants. 
VESTS - a layering effect in 
short and boxy or long and 
skinny looks worn with 
shirts, swearters, jackets and 
coats. 
PANTS - fuller at the hip, 
elasticized waist, soft fab-
rics, narrow leg tapered to 
ankle. 
SWEATERS - warm, luxuri-
ous, short or long sweater 
coats or jackets, pullovers in 
heavy fuzzier or light-
weights, knit dresses, two 
piece or layered. 
MIXED TEXTURES - play a 
key role in fall fashions. 
Light weight fabrics and 
textured or brushed surfaces 
mixed and matched for inter-
esting combinations. Such as 
a shallis dress or skirt with a 
soft touch topped with a 
shetland blazer or sweater 
using a similar color. 
EVENING - senuous, big 
sleeves, kimono dress in 
paisley prints or skinny pa-
jama in sheer chiffon; black 
velvet, piped satin and leath-
er waist wraps. Silk togos 
and quilted satin jackets. 
ACCESSORIES - tailored 
classical styling - wide leath-
er belts; small heat coveri-
ings, knit cap, cloches and 
berets; fur pelts and jackets 
and belts; ribbed stockings. 

LEGAL NOTICES 

NOTICE OF BOARD OF EQUALIZATION MEETING 

RISING STAR 	INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 

sheer patterned for evening, 
heavy warm leggings, and 
anklets or knee high under 
pants. 
FABRICS - cotton, wool, 
angora, rabbit hair, rayon, 
silk and polyester blends in 
tweeds, challis, damask, 
brushed suede, velveteen 
and satin ... tiny prints, 
quilted, fuzzy plaids, 
COLORS - brown, burgundy, 
green with bright accent 
colors. 
The Eastland County Fair 

Association met this week to 
begin plans for the 1978 
County Fair. This year's Fair 
is planned for September 29 -
30. Officers were elected and 
division chairmen are being 
secured. 
Mr. Berton Phillips of Old-

en will be the entertainment 
chairman and reported on 
plans for outstanding musi-
cal performers for Friday and 
saturday evenings during the 
fair. 
Concession chairmen will 

be Trudy Bird, Mrs. R.D. 
Hart, and Janet Thomas. 
De Gordon and Janet Tho-

mas, local extension agents, 
will be chairmen of the 
children's pet show. 
Jerry Morgan, of Cisco, 

presented the treasurer's re-
port. John Kidd, of Eastland, 
gave a summary report on 
progress to pave walkways in 
the showbarn for this year's 
Fair. 
R.H. Hart, of Eastland, 

suggested that the Hay Show 
be included in this year's 
Agriculture Division during 
the Fair. 

Mrs. Troy Cross reported 
on plans for this year's 
County Fair cookbooks which 
will be on sale prior and 
during the County Fair. 
The next County Fair Asso-

ciation meeting will be 
Thursday, July 27th at 8 p.m. 
in the Eastland Texas Elect-
ric Reddy Room. All workers 
and club representatives are 
urged to attend and support 
the Fair. 

In obedience to an order of the Board of Equalization regularly convened and 

sitting, notice is hereby given that said Board of Equalization will be in session at 
Eastland, Brown and 

Rising Star, Texas 	Comanche its regular meeting place in the City of 

County, Texas, at 9_  o'clock if M., beginning on 	MON d 	, the 
	

day 

of 	
l&

19 78  and from day to day thereafter,.,for the purpose of 

ixing determining, i 	and equalizing the value of any and aft taxable property situated 

in the said 	Rising Star 	 Independent School District, until 

such values have finally been determined for taxable purposes for the year 19 78  , and 

any and all persons interested, or having business with said Board, arc here notified 
EASTLAND MEDICAL 8 SURGICAL CLINIC, P.A. 

to he present. 

M.A. Treadwell, M.D. 

General Practice 

and Surgery 

RISING STAR 
Terry A. Treadwell, M.D. 

General and 

Vascular Surgery 
Texas, at Rising Star 

DONE BY ORDER OF THE BOARD OF EQUALIZATION OF 
Eastland, Brown and 

Independent School District,  Comanche 	County, 

Texas, the 	 day of A.D. , 19 78. 

ANNOUNCES THE ASSOCIATION OF 

BILL F. VERMILLION, M.D. 

for the practice of INTERNAL MEDICINE 

Office hours by appointment. 

Secretary 

Rising Star 

Independent School District 

• 

5,500 BTU/Hr. 
HIGH EFFICIENCY • 1 1 5 volt • De-
luxe Front • 3-speed fan • Energy Sav-
ing Options (intermittent fan and 
adjustable thermostat) • 2-way air 
direction • Air Changer control 
(exhaust) • Insta-Mount for fast in-
stallation • COMFORT GUARD -
control helps maintain comfort level 
you select 

Model AX P F 552 

21,300/20,800 BTU/Hr. 
• Deluxe Front • 3-speed fan • Energy 
Saving Options (intermittent fan and 
adjustable thermostat) • 4-way air 
direction • 2-way air changer control 
(Exhaust Fresh Air) • Slide-out 
Chassis for faster installation • 
COMFORT GUARD' control helps 
maintain comfort level you select 

Model ADF-21 3-4 

NOW GOING 49  95 
FORA  COOL 	 of • • 

NOW GOING 
FOR A COOL 

219 95 
 NOW 

FOR A COOL
GOING 469 s95  

Buy 
Now 
While 

S. so,„ 
Are 

High 
Main Street 

Rising Star, Texas 



Daughter of Owen Aikins' 
Receives B.S. Degree 

Proposal To Reduce Property Letter Postage Is Less dodctiOrig Taxes To Be Studied 	For Additional Ounces 	 mencement exercises held 
April 30 in the ACU Moody 
coliseum. 

Miss Aikin is a 1972 
graduate of Great Lakes 
Christian 	College 	in 
Beamsville, Ontario, 
Canada. 

Linda Aikin, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Owen Aikin, 
Box 136 in Rising Star, 
received t the bachelor of 
science in physical education 
degree from Abilene 
Chistian University during 
the 72nd annual com- 

Daughter Of Local Couple Weds Governor Dolph Briscoe 
this week said he is very 
interested in a proposal 
which could effectively 
reduce property taxes levied 
by Texas school disrict. 

The proposal, as put fourth 
by 	Representatives Jim 
Nugent of Kerrville and Lynn 
Nabers of Brownwood would 
dedicate one- fourth of the 
revenue from the State's 
general sales and use tax to 
reduce school ad valoreum 
taxes throughout the state. 

"The Legislature currently 
is meeting in a special 
session 	to 	consider 
legislation and proposed 
constitutional amendments 
which would return a portion 
of the current and projected 
state surplus to the people of 
Texas," Governor Briscoe 
said. "I am extremely in-
terested in any proposal 
which could result in a 
lowering of property taxes 
and particularly those levied 
by our Texas school districts. 

Nugent and Nabers have 
expressed hope for a hearing 
early this week on their 
proposal. 

mailing large evelopes or 
small packages weighingLi 
more than one ounce. 
Beyond 12 ounces, first 

class mail is called priority 
mail. Packages weighing up 
to 70 pounds can be mailed. 
Within a radious of 300 

miles of Rising Star, Texas, 
priority packages should be 
delivered the next business 
day. With the exceptin of a 
few distant areas, there is 
second day service within the 
U.S. for priority packages. 
Priority mail rates for a five 

lb. package range from $2.72 
for distances of up to 300 
miles to $4.83 to the most 
distant cities. 
For detailed rate 

information, customers can 
call the post office at 643-
2191. 

Many customers mailing 
heavy envelopes are not 
aware that postage is only 13 
cents for each additional over 
one ounce. Postmaster Don 
Boyett said today. 

Spots checks of large 
evelopes deposited in the 
Rising Star Post Office indi-
cate that families are often 
using two or more 15-cent 
stamps in mailing items 
weighing over one ounce, 
Postmaster Boyett finds. 
Postal rates effective May 

29 call for 15 cents for one 
ounce or less and 13 cents for 
each additional ounce 
through 12 ounces. 
Because many families have 

a surplus of 13 cent stamps 
on hand, Postmaster Boyett 
suggests that in addition to 
matching them with two-cent 
stamps, they may be used for 

Nugent and Nabers ex-
plained that to be eligible to 
receive additional state 
funds, under their proposal, 
a school district must reduce 
the ad valorem taxes it 
levies for maintenance and 
operation purposes by $200 
for each $220 it will receive. 
The maximum amount by 
which a school district would 
have to reduce its taxes 
would be 5 50 percent. The 
"new" state money the two 
House members said, would 
be distributed to school 
districts on a per Avergae 
Daily Attendance (ADA) 
basis with the 1978 share 
being $220 per ADA. 

"The existence of the 
surplus in the State Treasury 
land the projected surplus 
has to mean that the State is 
taking to much money from 
the pockets of Texas tax-
payers. In our opinion it is 
time to return part of that 
money to the taxpayers and 
we think our approach is 
most equitable," Nugent and 
Nabers said. 

Thursday, July 20, 1978:  
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FOR SALE: Free Stone 
Peaches- $3.00 	bushel- 
small, but a good quality-
*pick your containers- 1 mile 
west, I mile south of cotton 
wood store in Cross Plains. 
call 725- 2679. t61 

County Agent Brings 

Program 

FOR SALE: Good grain 
soyhum hay for sale lots of 
heads. contact Terry Geye or 
call 643- 6251. 29tfc • In Rising Star and* 

:adjoining counties, $4.00 * 
*per year; in Texas, S5.00* 
*per year; elsewhere in the * 
*U.S. 	and 	foreign * 
*countries, 58.00 per year. * 

466-500 

FOR SALE: cab over 
camper; fits wide long wheel 
base pickup. Excellent 
condition. Phone 817- 643-
1344. 29tfc 

will be 	cents. tach person 
is to bring a sack lunch and 
crafts to be displayed. Each 
club is to bring 50 cookies. 
Also, the May Club will 

hold its annual breakfast 
August 12 at 8:00 a.m. in the 
club house. All members are 
urged to attend. 
There will be a Housing 

Leader Training Program 
July 31st at 1:30 p.m. in the 
library meeting room. The 
topic will be, Framing Your 
Wall Decor. 
Refreshments of chips, 

dips, cake and punch were 
served by Alta Alexander 
and Polly Odom to Mmes. 
Margaret Livingston, Annie 
Mae Smith, Carol Nelson, 
Ann Lewis, Mae Underwood, 
Rosalie Glenn, Ella Holt, 
Clyde Allen, Tennsy Cook, 
Dorothy Harris, Entha 
Campbell, Mary Alice 
Reagan, and 1 guest, Janet 
Nelson. 

County Extension Agenty, 
Mary 	Alice 	Reagan, 
presented the program to the 
May Home Demonstration 
Club Wednesday, July 12 at 
2:00 in the club house. Her 
program was entitled, 
"Covering Walls With 
Fabric". She demonstrated 
several ways to use fabric to 
cover your walls, different 
ways of applying the fabrics 
and the different fabrics to 
use. 
The meeting opened with 

the group singing America 
the Beautiful led by Rosalie 
Glenn accompanied by Clyde 
Allen. The Club Prayer was 
repeated in unison. 
Alta Alexander, 

chairperson, presided over 
the meeting. 
Items discussed were the 

Three County Camp to be 
held in the Adam's Street 
Community Center July 19th 
at 9:30 a.m. Registration fee 

proposal 
Eastland 

Preliminary statistics show the 
would have the following effect in 
County: 
School 
District 

Publication 
Number 

* * * 	 * * * Peterson AFB Chapel, 
. Colorado Springs, 
Colorado, was the setting for 
the July 11 wedding of Debra 
Diane Duensing of Rising 
Star and Billy Paul Wagster 
of Newport, Arkansas. 
LDebra is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Edward A. 
Duensing. 

Chaplain Richard Trapp, 
Colonel USAF, officiated at 
the double ring ceremony. 

Honor attendants were 
Felicita Alicea and Joseph 
Alicea of Colorado Springs. 
Flower girl was Jessica 
Alicea. The bride's cousin, 
Glenda Junker of Fairbury 
Nebraska was the organist 
and also sang "Evergreen- 

he reception was held at 
Peterson AFB Officers 
CLub. 

The couple both of whom 
are 2d lieutentants in the Air 
Force, will make their home 
at Eglin AFB, Flordia. 

Out of town guests at- 
tending 	the 	wedding 
wereMr. and Mrs. R.A. 
Goss, o of Mission Texas, 
Mr. and Mrs. Martin 
Duensing and Mr. and Mrs. 
Darrell Junker of Fairburg 
Nebr; Mr. Henry Gleve of 
Brimen Kansas, Mr. and 
Mrfs. Paul Langner of Hoxie 
Kans. and the bride's 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. E.A. 
Duensing of Rising Star Tex. 

"New" 
State 
Funds 

Reduction 
in 

Property Tax 
CARD OF THANKS 

The family of George C. 
Kendrick wishes to thank all 
friends and relatives for all 
expression of love and 
sympathy. 	We 	wish 
especially to thank Bro. and 
sister McGinn and the ladies 
of the Full Gospel Church for 
the use of their church and 
the food and all the time they 
devoted to the family. We 
can only say Thank you- God 
will Bless You. The Family 
of Geo. C. Kendrick. 29- ltc 

FirCly7S  Poodle Puff j 
Parlor 

Pond 
Patterns.

odleGrooming. All Sizes ( A   

442.3406 
Carbon ISD 	 20 percent 
Cisco ISD 	50 percent 
Eastland ISD 	50 percent 
Gorman ISD 	50 percent 
Ranger ISD'.'."' 	48 percent 
Rising Star ISD 	31 percent 

$ 2,148 
33,291 
40,916 
17,671 
10,950 

4,944 

S 

S 
S 
S 

S 
S 

S 
S 

S 
S 
S 

,'; "New" State Funds means the amount of 
additional State Money to be received by a school 
district in excess of the amount the district 
currently is raising through ad valorem taxes for 
maintenance and operation purposes. 

Or 
442-3876 

Cisco 
S 

p-51i 
11•••••••••/•••••••••••••••.-01., 

Shakespearean Actors 
Visit Rising Star. 

Odessa 'to begin continuous 
productions of the three 
plays. Beginning Wednesday 
night, one production will be 
performed followed by 
different productions each 
night through Sunday. The 
theatre will seat 400 and 
reservations should be made 
especially on the weekends. 

A new twist this year is the 
"Brand New Opera" every 
Tuesday night which 
features country and 
western stars and also 
various local talent. 

Craig is truly enjoying his 
season with the group. He 
plays the leading character, 
Holfernes in the production 
"Love's Labors Lost". In 
"House of Saul", Craig is the 
armbearer. Othello" finds 
Craig assumes the roles of 
the 	third 	gentlemen, 
messenger and the look- out 
soldier...The long, hard 
hours (9 a.m. to 11 p.m.) 
never seem to phase Craig, 
his smile is always there. 
This young ambitious man 
will someday attain his life-
long gold of becoming a 
professional 	entertainer. 
Along the way, whoever he 
comes in contact with will 
never forget this charming 
young man. 

Everyone is welcome to 
attend productions which 
will continue through August. 
13th. Look up Craig and he 
will show you the sights. 

PUBLISHER'S COPY 	 State Bank No- .... 47; ...... 

Consolidated Report of Condition of "  FIRST STATE BANK  

Pam Up (slat.) 4647) 

sr 

of 	RISING STAR 	in the State of 	TEXAS 	and Domestic Subsidiaries at the dose of 

business on 	JUNE 30 	, 19  78  

BALANCE SHEET 	 ASSETS 	Sch. 	Item Col. 

1. Cash and due from banks   C 	7 

2. U.S. Treasury securities  	B 	1 	E ......... 

3. Obligations of other U.S. Government agencies and corporations 	 B 	2 	E 	  

4. Obligations of States and political subdivisions 	 B 	3 	E ....... 

5. Other bonds, notes, and debentures   B 	4 	E .... ..... 

6. Corporate stock 

Thou. MII. 

1 991 1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9a 

b 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

548 
none 
642 1 
none 
none 
none 7. Trading account securities 
200 8. Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell .... D 	4 	  

9. a. Loans. Total (excluding unearned income)   A 	10 	  

b. Less: Reserve for possible loan losses 

c. Loans, Net 

10. Direct lease financing 

829 7 
50 

7 779 
none 

241 11. Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises 

12. Real estate owned other than bank premises 

13. Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies 

14. Customers' liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding 

15. Other assets 

16. TOTAL ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru 15) 

1 
none 
none 
182 

12 584 
LIABILITIES 

17. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations 

18. Time and savings deposits of individuals. partnerships, and corporations 

19. Deposits of United States Government 

20. Deposits of States and political subdivisions 

21. Deposits of foreign governments and official institutions 

22. Deposits of commercial banks 

23. Certified and officers' checks 

24. TOTAL DEPOSITS (sum of items 17 thru 23) 

a. Total demand deposits 

b. Total time and savings deposits 

25. 	Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase 

26. Other liabilities for borrowed money 

27. Mortgage indebtedness 

28. Acceptances executed by or for account of this bank and outstanding 

29. Other liabilities 

30. TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures) 

31. Subordinated notes and debentures 

Sch. 	Item 

F 	If 

F 	If 

F 	2 

F 	3 

F 	4 

F 	5+6 

F 	7 

F 	8 

F 	8 

E 	4 

Col. 

A 

8+C 

A+B+C 

A+B+C 

A+B+C . 

A+B+C 

A 

766 4 17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

a 

b 

25 

26 

27 

28 

29 

6 114 
48 

348 
none 

45 
126 
447 11 

403 A 

B+C 

11111W • Craig Campbell, Jillian Raye and David Mintonk4Olesi 
Lost" and "House of Saul". 
Jillian is cast as the leading 
lade, 	Desdemona 	in 
"Qthello". 	In 	"Love's 
Labors Lost", she is cast in 
the role of Princess of 
France and in "House of 
Saul", she portrays Naomi 
the Queen (wife of Saul). 

Jillian enjoys ballet and is 
enrolled in the University of 
Florida where she is 
studying theatre. 

When rehearsals began on 
June 4th, David Minton of 
Petersburg, Virginia was 
among the seventeen actors 
rial'nfing his time and talents 

to the productions. The parts 
David played were Montano 
in "Othello", Costard in 
"Love's Labors Lost" and 
Benaiah in "House of Saul." 

David is a graduate of the 
University of Virginia with a 
Masters Degree in English. 
His plans include conbining 
both. 

The two, David and Jillian 
were touring the area with 
our own Craig Campbell. 
Craig is studying with the 
Globe for his first season. 
They were on a two day 
break before returining to 

Traveling through the 
town of Rising Star were two 
very interesting and talented 
actors performing with the 
Globe Theatre of the South-
west located in Odessa, 
Texas. 

Jillian Raye, originally 
from 	the 	Melbourne- - 
Sidney region of Australia is 
spending her summer 
performing long and hard 
hours with the only authentic 
Shakespearean replice in the 
world. Three productions are 
being performed including: 
"Othello-, "Love's Labors 

9 
Colorado where they at-
tended the wedding of their 
daughter, Debra, to Billy 
Wagster. Mr. and Mrs. R.A. 
Goss accompanied the 
Duensings to Colorado and 
also attended the wedding. 

While at Colorado Springs 
they took a sight seeing tour 
to Manitou Springs, Garden 
of the Gods, U.S. Air Force 
Academy, cave of the winds 
and the Cheyenne Mountain 
Complex. 

30 

31 

EQUITY CAPITAL 

none none (Par value) No shares outstanding 

No shares authorized 

No shares outstanding 

32. Preferred stock 

33. Common stock 

32 a 

a.  

b.  

50,000 
250 50.000 (Par value) 33 

250 34. Surplus 

35. Undivided profits 

36. Reserve for contingencies and other capital reserves 

37. TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 32 thru 36) 

38. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 30, 31. and 37)  

MEMORANDA 

34 

519 35 

36 

37 

38 

none 

1 019 
12 584 

1 Average for 30 calendar days ending with call date: 
846 1 Mrs. Al Lindemuth of 

Anchorage, Alaska, is 
visiting in the home of her 
daughters and family Mr. 
and Mrs. Douglas Fisher and 
David, of May. 

- - - 
Visiting in the home of Mr. 

and Mrs. John Schlittler of 
Baird were Jillian Raye, and 
David Minton son of Mrs. 
Burton F. Minton of 
Petersburg Virginia. They 
were shown the local sights 
by Craig Campbell, son of 
the Schlittlers. 

Cash and due from banks (corresponds to item 1 above) 

Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell (corresponds to item 8 above) 

Total loans (corresponds to item 9a above) 

Time deposits of $100,000 or more (corresponds to Memoranda items 3a plus 3b below) 

Total deposits (corresponds to item 24 above) 

Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase (corresponds to item 25 above) 

Other liabilities for borrowed money (corresponds to item 26 above)  

1a a.  

b.  

c.  

d.  
e.  
f.  

g 

605 
738 7 Williams High School 297 

11 573 

Homecoming Slated Mr. and Mrs. E. M. Roberts 
and Mr. and Mrs. Carlos 
Cotton and children visited 
Mrs. Roberts sister Mrs. 
Irene Stanton in Shamrock 
Texas also Mrs. Roberts 
brother T.L. Campbell at 
Hollis Okla. last week. 

none 
none 
10 2. Standby letters of credit outstanding (as of cell date) 

3. Time deposits of $100,000 or more (as of call date) .  

a. Time certificates of deposit in denominations of $100.000 or more 

b. Other time deposits in amounts of 5100.000 or more 

2 Williams. 
Registration will begin at 1 

p.m. at the Chislohm 
Restaurant and will be 
followed by a 4 p.m. 

Alumni are asked to bring 
pictures 	and 	other 
memorabilia. 

Out of town guests are 
encouraged to stay at the 
Riverside 	Motel- - (it 	is 
adjacent to the Chsolm 
Restuarant. 

Anyone wishing fui-ther 
inf orma t 	may 	contact 
Chairman, Donald Looney at 
Rt. 4, Box 12150 Weatherford 
Texas 76086. 

The Williams High School 
Homecoming has been 
slated for Saturday, August 
12th, 1978. 

Registration will get un-
derway Friday, August 11th 
at the Chisolm Restaurant in 
Brownwood, Texas. 

Chairman, Donald Looney 
stated that there will be an 
officers meetings at 8 p.m. at 
the Riverside Motel, Friday. 

The Homecoming day will 
begin with breakfast at 8 
a.m. a at the Riverside 
Motel. This will be followed 
by a 9 a 	caravan to 

120 3a 

b 177 

I.  Mildred Hommel, Ase't. V. P. SWEAR 
AFFIRM of Ow above-named bank, do solemnly that this report of condition 

is true and correct, to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

Mr. and Mrs. Preston 
Alexander of Fordyce, 
Arkansas visited in the 
homes of Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Burns and Mrs. Ruby 
new of Rising Star during the 
weekend.. 

- - - 

Correct-Attest: 
t• 	611111, A`•*.. 

• ... .... 
• • 

Directors. 
Rusty Owen, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. Douglas Owen is 
listed in critical condition in 
Hendrick Hospital in 
Abilene 	following 	a 
motorcycle accident Mon. 
evening. Douglas Owen is 
the Vocational- Ag, teacher 
in Rising Star. 

State of 	TEXAS  	EASTLAND 	 , ie. 
Sworn to and subscribed before me this ............ 12-th, C"ntlf 

of 
day of 	 July 	  

My commission expires 	 , 	

19  78  
and I hereby certify that 1 am not an officer or director of 

30 	19 BD 	
ank. 

June  

. • ) 
• 4•W 

4.‘ 
NOT 

044.4,„1, Notary Public. .* 
A • • ....... • ..(.\.‘ 

) LO'• 1,4 

Mr. and Mrs. E.A. 
Duensing have just returned 
from Colorado Springs, 

JF-ANNE BBB 



Digital Switching 

We're using it to hold the 
line on higher phone rates. 

Every dollar we can shave off our operating expenses is a-dollar that helps us 
delay the need for rate increases 	• • 

Our objective, of course, is to hold the line on operating costs without 
reducing the quality of your telephone service 

Sometimes this requires Continental to 
invest huge sums of money in technologi-
cal advancements that, in the long run, 
save money Digital switching is one of 
these advancements 

Digital switching equipment not only 
helps us control costs with reduced main-
tenance requirements, but also provides 
better noise levels and faster service 
when you dial a number. 

It handles more calls with fewer trunk 
lines, yet occupies about 80% less floor 
space than conventional equipment. 

Installed in areas where fast growth is 
expected, the new equipment will let us meet the growth without the expense 
of building.neWlfaCilities 	.• 	 - • •  

Because the rates you paY-rof telephone service are based on..our.Costs of_ 
doing business throughout our system, digital switching works in your behalf 
wherever we install it 	• 

Its one of the ways we're doing our best to do more for you. 

Cr Continental Telephone 
of Texas Doing our best 

to do more for you 

Ili 	
- 

he BACK FORTY 	 Or 

TAX.  

- 
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"ALL THE MONEY YOU MADE ON CATTLE WENT TO PAY 
YOUR INTEREST — YOUR INTEREST IN RACE HORSES, 
WOMEN, AND GAMBUNG." 

Is all the money you make being wasted? Why not 
invest in the future? Certificates of Deposit is a good 
investment and can be purchased in various amounts 
to fit your personal situation. 

Member F.D.I.C. 

EXCELLENCE IN BANKING 	PARKING 	' DRIVE-IN BANKING 

RISING STAR, TEXAS 76471 
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ortion  Ladies. 
Girth  -A Accessories 

Summer Sale 
Close Out On All Spring  

$.^ 
dos' 

Summer Merchandise 	P‘`.4t,  

At Savings Up To 50% 
(i",afe 	Prophecy 
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J.H. Collectables 
Bobbie Brooks 
Jones of N.Y. 
Condor 
Theo & others 

:goo 800 North Seaman • Eastland. Texo 
Telephone 629 8141 S 
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Thursday, July 20, 1978 

Old Time Country Fair 

Being Planned For Aug. 12 

In Cross Plains City Park 

Twelve From 

Rising Star 

ATTEND 
Worshop 

• 

"As It Looks From. Here" 
OMAR BURLESON 

Congressman 17th District 
of Lometa, Joseph Muhlc of 
Hobbs, N.M. Catherine 
Muhle, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Lindley, Scotty, Jamie, and 
Toby all of May. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sonny 
Quimby, and son. Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Quimby. and 
Mrs. Nell Robason have been 
visiting Mr. and Mrs. Ira 
Nelson recently. They had a 
home made ice cream party 
last Saturday evening. 

Mrs. Genie Crooks, Matt 
and Kathleen of Big Spring 
spent the weekend with Mrs. 
Inia Crooks. Genie returned 
home Sunday. Matt and 
Kathleen will remain with 
their grandmother for a 
week. 

Gary Michael, Meleah. 
Ryan. and Emily visited 
Gary's parents. Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Michael last 
weekend. Mrs. Lugene 
Howard spent Sunday with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Michael. 

Mrs. Vivian Loper left July 
10th for a family reunion in 
Lubbock. Mr. and Mrs. 
Verdell Haney left Friday for 
the same reunion. Mrs. 
Loper and Mrs. Haney are 
sisters. 

Mrs. Mary Kent remains in 
critical condition in the 
Brownwood community 
Hospital. 

Mr. O.L. Oaks remains on 
the sick list this week. 

Richard Verdine of Lubbock 
visited his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Verdell Haney, last 
week. 

Mrs. Annie Lester is home 
from the Brownwood Com-
munity Hospital. She 
continues to improve. 

Mr. Jim Lowrance and 
Melody; Mr. and Mrs. 
Michael Lowrance and two 
sons of near Spurger; and 
Billy Mike Michael of Gold-
thwaite spent several days 
with Mrs. Magdeline Driskill 
recently. • 

An Old Time Country Fair is 
being planned for August 12 
at the Cross Plains City Park 
to be held in conjunctin with' 
the Old Settlers Reunion. 
Festivities will begin at 9:00 
a.m. The Old Time Country 
Fair is being sponsored by 
the Beta Sigma Phi Sororty in. 
Cross Plains. All area groups 
or organizations are urged to 
set up booths, which are 
available for $5.00 or $10.00, 
by calling (817) 725-6274 or 
(817) 725-7237 for reserva-
tions. The deadline for 
reserving a booth is August 
5. 
A barbecue lunch will be 

served at $3.00 per plate for 
adults and $2.00 per plate for 
children. 

A Playday will also be held, 
with registration for events 
to be from 10-11:30 a.m. 
Events will begin at 3:00 
p.m. Entry fee will be 50 
cents for each event entered. 
Events planned are barrel 

race, rescue race, red wagon 
race, boot race, goat or pig 
scramble, sack race, tabacco 
'spitting contest, cow chip 
throwing, watermelon seed 
Spitting, steer riding, break 
away roping, relay race on 
foot, and pony express race. 
Riding clubs are encouraged 
to participate! 
The divisions for the play 

day are as follows: Pee Wee: 
5-8 yrs., Juniors: 9-13 yrs., 
Seniors: 14-19 yrs., Pee Wee 
Snior Citizens: 20-35 yrs., 
Junior Senior Citizens: 35-50 
yrs., and Senior Senior 
Citizens: 50-100 yrs. First, 
second, third, fourth, fifth, 
and sixth place ribbons will 
be given in each division for 
each event. 
One of the main attractions 

will be a pet show. Everyone 
is urged to get his pet well 
groomed and show him off. 
Any kind of pet may enter. 

Everyone is invited to come 
and join the fun. 

PEOPLE ARE ASKING IF 
WASHINGTON HAS 
received the "message" 
from California's adoption of 
Proposition 13. The answer 
is definitely yes. 

AS A MATTER OF FACT 
FOR THE LAST SEVERAL 
MONTHS momentum has 
been gathering for the 
reduction of taxes at all 
levels of Government. The 
California action is spurring 
efforts in many States, in-
cluding our own State of 
Texas, to reduce taxes. On 
the Federal level there is 
reasonable certainty that 
when a tax bill is enacted by 
the Congress, there will be a 
reduction of approximately 
$15 billion- $10 billion for 
individual taxpayers and $5 
billion for business. 

THERE IS ALSO GREAT 
MOMENTUM TO REDUCE 
TAX ON CAPITAL GAINS 
from its present rate of about 
49 percent to at least 35 
percent or possibly to 25 
percent, which was the rate 

STEPHENVILLE-- 
Members of the Rising star 
High School yearbook staff 
received the spirit award at a 
three-day workshop held 
recently on the Tarleton 
State University campus. 
Members of the staff who 

attended the workshop were 
Belinda Switzer, Marilyn 
Wilson, Marc Kizer, Kathy 
Reed, Lance Lewis, Mark 
Wilson, Taby Chambers, 
Paula New, Pam Ratliff, 
Deana Gage, Carla Bowers, 
and Kim Harris. 
The workshop was 

sponsored by Tarleton and 
Taylor Publishing Company 
and involved all aspects of 
the preparation of an annual. 
Special photography 

workshops were conducted 
by Darrell Thomas of Texas 
Tech and Joe Robinson of 
Junction. 

Instructors from the Taylor 
staff were Vana Parker, 
Glenn Gerloff, Ronnie 
Stapleton, and Walter 
Adams. 
At an awards luncheon held 

of conclude the workshop all 
students and advisors were 
awarded certificates of com-
pletion by TSU president Dr. 
W.O. Trogdon .  
Approximately 80 students 

and advisors attended the 
seminar. 

Jennifer Brown of 
Palestine, Jerry Lobestein of 
Brownwood. Melvin Musick 
of Owens, Travis and Ketih 
Dean Lindley and Bradley 
were all visitors in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Michael while Gary Michael 
and his children were there. 

Mr. and Mrs. Marion J. 
McDaniel are still bragging 
about their latest grandson. 
James Steven Peterson of 
Hillsboro. He is the 9 lb. and 
9 oz. son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Morris Peterson. James 
Steven was born June 26, 
1978. 

CARD 
OF THANKS 

Mr. and Mrs. Clendon 
Chambers, and Gwen Lee 
have spent a few days in New 
Orleans to visit the Super 
Dome for the Mike Jaggers 
Concert. Eighty thousand 
people attended the event. 

Mr. and Mrs. J.J. Smith 
and Joey visited Mr. and 
Mrs. James J. Smith recently 
Joey has remained with his 
grandparents for part of his 
summer vacation. 

Mr. Henry Allen has 
returned home from the 
Abilene hospital where he 
has been for several days. 
His expected open heart 
surgery was unnecessary 
after minor surgery. 

We wish to thank all the 
nice people in Rising Star 
who sent cards, letters and 
prayers while we were in the 
hospital. A special thanks to 
the 	Higginbotham 
employees for the beautiful 
pajamas. 
Again we thank you all for 

being so kind. May God bless 
you always. 
Pauline and Emmett Howard In11, 

deficit. But, the Federal 
Government with its huge 
National debt and a deficit 
hovering between $50 and $60 
billion will be called upon to 
make up the difference to 
finance programs at levels 
before tax cuts were made. 

THE POINT HERE IS 
THAT IT IS MORE 
POPULAR reducing taxes, 
than reducing expenditures. 

EVERYONE HAS THEIR 
IDEAS ABOUT WHERE 
CUTS IN SPENDING should 
be made. Some want to cut 
back 	on 	defense 
preparedness by eliminating 
some of the most modern 
weapons. We know that 
Social Security is not going to 
be trimmed and no one 
really believes that our 
expensive unemployment 
compensa tionsys tern, 
costing $20 billion, is going to 
be appreciatively cut back. 

THOSE FROM THE 
CITIES THINK THAT A 
CRACKDOWN SHOULD 
supports, others believe that 
our interestate highway 
system, the finest in the 
world, should be practically 
eliminated, while some feel 
that more money instead of 
less should go into en- 
vironmental 	protection, 
industrial safety, and public 
health. 

NO ONE BELIVES THAT 
VETERANS BENEFITS 
ARE GOING TO BE tam-
pered with and so on and on 
it g goes with not very much 
said about how all these 
obligations, authorized for 
four or five years in ad-
vance, a are really going to 
be shrunk to the point of real 
savings. 

JUSTICE OLIVER 
WENDELL HOLMES ONCE 
SAID THAT HE WAS glad to 
pay taxes. They were, he 
said, his "investment in 
civilization." Most people 
prubably feel this way too, 
but as we have said in this 
space time and again, the 
real complaint should be how 
our hard earned tax money 
is spent. So, firing one barrel 
at tax reductions is half the 
answer; the other has to 
shoot down high spending. 

Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Wendle Bailey last 
Friday were Mr. and Mrs. 
Franklin Graves of Long 
Beach, Calif., Mrs. Graves 
sister from Gorman and Mrs. 
Gertrude Courtwright of Ris-
ing Star. Their Sunday 
guests were Mrs. Bulah Mae 
(Decker) Whitley of Houston, 
Mrs. Verna Mae Thompson 

before the tax_act of 1969. 
WHEN A TAX. BILL IS 

BROUGHT UP FOR 
CONSIDERATION 
BEFORE THE year is out, 
there will be a proposal to 
cut income taxes by as much 
as one- third. This is known 
as the Kemp- Roth Amend-
ment which we will, in the 
meantime, be hearing a 
great deal about. There is no 
question that people are fed 
up with big Government, big 
spending, and big taxes. The 
weakness in these proposals 
for tax reductions is the 
usual failure to relate it to 
spending. In the case of 
California, the State is 
already 	looking 	to 
Washington for money to 
make up revenues lost by the 
property tax decrease 
recently voted. New York 
City has led the Nation in 
asking the Federal Govern-
ment to bail them out of their 
bankrupt situation. Aisde 
from taxes, the only way a 
State or municipality can 
raise money is through the 
sale of bonds voted by the 
people; 	the 	Federal 
Government can either turn 
the crank at the Federal 
reserve and issue more 
paper money or go out into 
the money market and 
borrow it. 

THROUGH REVENUE 
SHARING AND GRANTS OF 
VARIOUS KINDS the 
Federal Government is 
already contributing a 
substantial part in support of 
State and local governments. 
As taxes are reduced by 
local governments, 
Washington will be looked to 
more and more to make up 
the difference in the cost of 
various program. Forty-
four States have a surplus in 
their treasuries at this time, 
five States have a balanced 
budget, and one State is in 

Dorothy Diddle To Be Presented dir 	4111," .110.  41011.  410P.  

Service Award 

[ 	Y our Local 
Newspaper 

Does 

Commerical printing, 
Tome people once believed 
:hat shooting arrows under a 
:ruit tree would cause the 
fruit to fall off the tree 
just as the arrows fell. 

0 

FRIGIDAIRE A Heritage of 

Quality Since 1918 

Want to be your oven 
boss? Cafe in proven 
location (Elite Cafe). 
Ideal for couple or  p. 
family, building and 
fixturer-lock, stock 
and barrel. Lease 
terms available. 
Owner will finance to 
qualified party. Call 
for more information 

GOLDEN 

business and education will 
conduct sessions on energy, 
student 	motivation, 
nutrition, sex stereotyping, 
managing metrics, consumer 
buying skills and consumer 
affairs careers, student 
success in the food service 
busness, and education for 
parenthood. 
According to Ms. Caroline 

Bode, of San Antonio, Presi-
dent of VHTAT, more than 
2800 teachers are expected to 
attend the conference. 
Mrs. Diddle will also assist 

with registration for the State 
Inservice Education 
Conference for Homemaking 
Teachers from 11:30 a.m. to 
2:30 p.m. Monday, July 24, 
1978. Registration will be in 
the North Hall on Level 2 of 
the Dallas Convention 
Center. 

REALTY 
300 N. Main Bldg. 

Southside Entrance 
643-2519?  , 

doll,  • 

p. 

p. 

Frigidaire Jet Cone Waihers. 
Every laundry day, you'll be proud of the 
way they get your 
clothes clean. 

Dorothy Diddle of Rising 
Star High School will be 
presented a service award by 
the Vocational Homemaking 
Teachers Association of 
Texas at the organization's 
awards banquet at the Dallas 
Hilton Hotel July 26. The 
award is in recognition of her 
service to the teaching profe-
ssion as well as to the 
VHTAT. 

Ms. Diddle, a teacher in the 
Rising Star High School, will 
also participate in a four day 
State Inservice Conference 
for the professional deve-
lopment of vocational 
homemaking teachers. The 
conference, planned by the 
Homemaking Education 
Division, Texas Education 
Agency, will feature twenty-
one special interest sessions 
providing opportunities for 
the home economists to learn 
ways to integrate new know-
ledge and techniques into 
their teaching. Nationally 
known authorities in 

• Rugged Dependability: It's an-
integral part of every Frigidaire 
Heavy Doty.  Washer.. 	. • 

Wash a Full 18-lb, Load or just a 
few pieces. with just the right •  
amount of water. 

All Frigidaire Jet Cone Washers 
have an exclusive Up and-Down 
Agitator Action. It gets clothes 
down to the bottom of the tub. 
where Cleaning Power is Greatest. 

'an average of 9 times per regular 
Wash Cycle. 

1131 
FRIGIDAIRE 

Frigidaire Automatic Dryers. 

They offer care for today's 

fabrics, backed by the 

59-year Frigidaire tradition 

of craftsmanship. 

Every Frigidaire Dryer offers you 
the Capacity to Help Save Energy: 
A Full 18-lb. Capacity that lets 
you Dry One Big Load, instead of 
Several Energy•Wasting Smaller Loads. 

Frigidaire Dryers know when to 
take the Heat off — to Save you 
more than Just Energy. 

The 3.Step Starting Procedure Helps 
Prevent Accidental Dryer Operation. 

WEST TEXAS UT1LMES COMPANY 

Qualified Factory-Trained Servicemen Offer You The Finest in Appliance Service. 

A MYTIIIWT of 	( .11141 /11X1 .1.1111t1 {A.4,1 ',%•16.1” 



THE ROACH 

THE ANT 

OFFICE: 817-629-1781 

DALLAS: 214-7504089 

We want to SELL your ratings. 

RESIDENTIAL 

Brand New, 3 bedroom, 2 bath home on lovely 2 acre country setting with 
liveoaks, native stone fireplace, 2442 sq. ft. living area, with lots of extras. 
Walking distance of lake, golf course, and country club. Enjoy living at its finest, 
asking $75,000., 

Enjoy Lake Living, in this 3 bedroom, 2 bath home on deeded lot with good water 
front. Paneling, fireplace, carpet, large screened porch, and chain link fence. 

'Asking $32,500. 
Another Lake Home, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, with approximately 2500 sq. ft. living 

space, central heat and air, carpet, 1 car garage, large glass porch overlooking 
lake. Close to country club and golf course. Asking price $49,000. 

Immaculate, 3 bedroom, 2 bath home on corner lot in good neighborhood. 
Central heat and air, built- ins, garage with utility room, carpet, custom- made 
drapes, large covered patio, fenced back yard with trees. Seperate garage- office 
combination at back of lot. A nice place for $39,500. 

Country Living, in this nice 2 bedroom home on 1 acre with trees, city water, 
screened porch, and carpet. Located on pavement, close to Cisco lake and golf 
course. Some assumable financing, Ideal for retirement, $32,000. 

Extra Large, and gracious 3 bedroom 21/2  baths, custom brick home with 2700 
sq. ft. living space, central heat and air, carpet, and many extras. A real show 
place on a city block, with view of city. $75,000. 

Handy Man, needed for this 2 bedroom, house in need of some repairs in Olden 
on approx. 2 acres, city water, fruit trees, good water well and excellent garden 
spot. Asking $12,000. 

Budget Minded, small 2 bedroom house on corner with 3 lots in Cisco. Plenty of 
room for expansion, close to I- 20, economically priced at $8,200. 

ACREAGE 

City Block, with 16 lots in Cisco, wooded, with street frontage on 3 sides, close to 
I- W. Ideal for mobile home, horse lover, or just for investment. Asking price 
$4500. 

Mobile Homesite, 1 acre, 6 miles S. of Carbon, 1/2  minerals, Westbound water, 
electricity, fenced with steel gate, on county road. Ready to go for $3200. 

12 Acres, ideal for ranchetters, building or mobile home sites, street frontage on 
3 sides, fenced, 17/4  minerals, conveniently located on edge of Cisco, Choose 1 acre 
or all to suit your needs. Asking $1,000 acre. 

10 Acres. of good bottom land, all coastal, large mature pecan trees, city water, 
access to lake water, Scenic home site with immediate possession, on edge of 
Eastland. 

27 Acres, with liveoaks and excellent deer hunting, located Southeast of Carbon, 
financing arranged with 10 percent down. Offered at $375 acre. 

38 Acres- 15 acres of coastal- stock tank- pavement frontage- Would consider 
splitting- not far from Lake Leon- asking price- $475.00 acre. 

14 acres- Hiway frontage- scattered trees- beautiful home site or mobile home 
site- small creek- lease purchase plan available- Easy way to buy land. Come 
see this place. 

10 acres- 3 miles south of Cisco- good county road frontage- city water 
coming- Ideal for building site or mobile home- some financing available thru 
owner. 
..10 to 120 acre tracts- Southeast of Lake Leon- excellent frontage- several 
financing plans- good building sites- Ideal for retirement. Call or come see. 

30 Acres, located Southwest of Cisco, good fences, for $400 acre. 
35 Acres, all in cultivation, county road frontage, stock tank, WaySide area, 

asking price $375 acre. • 
60 Acres farm, 2.5 acres peanut allotment, water well, located 1 mile off 

pavement, sell all or will divide for $620 acre. 
67 Acres, with I- 20 and county road frontage, scattered trees, native grass, 2 

stock tanks, some minerals. Owner financing for $550. 
• 75:Acres, coastal and love grass, 1/4  minerals, 3 spring fed stock tanks, located S. 
of Cisco. $550.00 acre. 

• 108 Acres, peanut farm, 98 acres of allotment, 5 water wells, Gorman area of-
fered at $650 acre. 

120 Acres, with county road frontage, tree covered, good hunting, located 8 
miles S. of Eastland, asking price $390 acre. 
• 120 Acres, good building site, highway frontage, 40 acres coastal, minerals, 

small creek, scattered trees, good location and fences, 10 percent down payment, 
$475 acre. 

140 Acres, Stephens County, fenced, lots of highway frontage, good bird hunting, 
stock tank, consider splitting, some assumable financing, $285 acre. 

180 Acres, excellent lake site, west of Gorman, good deer and bird hunting, 
scenic, liveoak trees, financing arranged, $340 acre. 

160 Acres, Gorman area, pavement frontage, old farm house, 100 acres 
cultivation, 70 acre Peanut allotment, 1,2  minerals, owner financing available, 
Possibly consider splitting place, asking $490 acre. 

288 Acres South of Cisco- Excellent hunting place- lots of trees with some open 
land- 3 stock tanks- good fences- Owner would consider splitting- some 
minerals- asking 325.00 acre. 

512 Acre Ranch- Burnet County- 3 bedroom home and guest house- 3 barns- 3 
creeks, stock tanks approx. 125 acres bottom land fields- Excellent deer and 
turkey- This is a good ranch with 50 percent of the minerals and would be the only 
hinting lease you would ever need. 

880 Acres- Eastland County- Excellent Hunting- 2 good water wells- stock 
tanks- Ultra- Scenic- Invest- or terms with owner financing priced well below 
average land prices- Ideal combination ranch- recreation- investment property. 

ATTENTION: LICENSED REALTORS OR PROSPECTIVE LICENSES- We are 
now taking applications for full or part time sales persons- Call for interview- We 
have many other listings on ranches, motels, and apartments. We want toltUi. 
your listings. 

OFFICE PHONE 
DALLAS OFFICE 
Res.- Eddie Kincaid 
Robert Kincaid 
Myra LOwrance 

Eastland 
Dallas 

817- 629- 1781 
214- 750- 0089 
817- 647- 1367 
817- 629- 2815 
817- 629- 8431 

Star Man Honored As "Roadrunner" 

Deaths & Funerals Of The Year 
47, 

One son, one daughter, 
nine brothers and one sister 
also preceded her in death. 

Verna Wisethan 

had lived here since. She Former RN'in' married James Clayton  
Costin in 1912 in Colorado 
City. He preceded her in 5. - • 
death in 1926. She then 
married John Wesley Costin 
in 1928 in Carlsbad, N.M., 
and he preceded her in death 
Dec. 7, 1949. She was a 
member of First United 
Methodist Church. She 
received a lifetime certificate 
and pin from the Northwest 
Conference of United Meth-
odist Churches and the 
Women's Society of 
Christian Service. 
Survivors include a 

daughter, Iris Winchester of 
Rising Star; a son, Warren 
Costin of Colorado City; a 
sister. Zannie Key of 
Colorado City; five 
grandchildren; and four 
great-grandchidren. 
She was preceded in death 

by a son, J.C., and a grand-
son. James Austin Carver was 

FRANKE'S 
PEST CONTROL 

graduated in 1949 with a B.S. 
Degree in Agriculture- 
Majoring 	in 	Dairy 
Manufacturing. James has 
been associated with the 
dairy industry since his 
graduation from college. 

He is a Senior Sales 
Representative with In-
ternational Paper Company, 
Single Service Division. His 
Sales Territory covers 
Arkansas, New Mexico, 
parts of Oklahoma and 
Texas. 

Austin as he is now in 
Rising Star and his wife Reta 
reside in Duncanville, Texas. 
They have one daughter, 
Christie a Texas Tech 
University graduate. Who 
resides in Little Rock, 
Arkansas. 

He is a brother to Mrs. 
Thurman (Beulah) Cox of 
Kermit, Texas. 

honored as "Roadrunner" of 
the year at the New Mexico 
Dairy Products Processors 
Association annual con-
vention. The Roadrunners is 
an organization made up of 
sales representatives selling 
to the dairy plants in New 
Mexico. The annual con-
vention was June 16 and 17, 
at the Inn of the Mountain 
Gods, Mescalero, New 
Mexico. 

James was born at Cisco, 
Texas and moved to the 
Rising Star area with his 
parents the late Mr. and 
Mrs. O.D. Carver at a very 
early age. He attended 
public school at Cook, 
Crocker and Rising Star, 
graduating from high school 
in 	1942. 	Following 
graduation he went on active 
duty in the Navy, serving in 
the South Pacific until 
discharged in 1946. 

He entered Texas Tech 
University in 1946 and 

State Licensed and Insured 
(Um P.C.l. No. 26701 

PEST CONTROL White's Celebrate 50th 
Also  

Missionaries in Eastland for 
The Church of Jesus Christ 
of Latter-Day Saints for the 
next several months are 
Elder Craig Monson, left, 
and Elder Jeff Newman, 
right. 
Elder Jeff Newman of 

Layton, Utah, and Elder 
Craig Monson Airmo, Idaho 
have accepted call's to serve 
in two counties for The 
Church of Jesus Christ of 
Latter-Day Saints. 
The two missionaries will 

work for several months in 
Eastland and Stephens 
counties. They share an 
apartment at 1007 W. Main, 

West Apt. For further infor-
mation or questions call: 
629-8247. 
Elder Newman's previous 

assignment was in Dumas. 
Elder Monson worked in the 
Irving area before coming to 
Eastland. 

There are over 30,000 
Mormons missionaries serv-
ing throughout the world, at 
their own expense for two 
years. 	All 	L D . S . 
Missionaries arc called and 
set apart by The First 
Presidency of The Church of 
Jesus Christ of Latter-Day 
Saints in Salt Lake City Utah. 

Ada Folkner 
Funeral services for Mrs. 

Ada Sarah Folkner, 89, of 
Rising Star, were at 3 p.m. 
Saturday at the Higgin-
botham Funeral Home 
Chapel in Rising Star. Arthur 
C. Latson, minister of the 
Itasca Church of Christ, offi-
ciated, assisted by Owen 
Aikin, pastor of the Rising 
Star Church of Christ. Burial 
was in Amity Cemetery. 
Mrs. Folkner died at 8:15 

a.m. Thursday in E.L. 
Graham Memorial Hospital. 
She was born November 1, 

1888, in Van Zandt County. 
She was a member of the 
Church of Christ at May. She 
married Alvie Folkner in 
1908 in Comanche. She had 
lived in Rising Star 24 years. 

Mr. Folkner preceded her in 
death in 1974. 
Survivors include two sons, 

Raymond of Portales, N.M., 
and Herbert of Cisco; eight 
grandchildren and 10 great-
grandchildren. *Ticks 

*Silverfish 

*And Other 	
*Bird Control 

Pests 	
•Odor Control 

*Roaches 

*Termites 

*Fleas 

.Ants Wedding Anniversary 

Residential & Commercial 
dP KINCAID REAL ESTATE 

100 S. Seaman Prelermite Service 
On New Homes 

Services for Verna Lee 
Wiseman, 44, of Rising Star 
and formerly of Snyder, who 
died Thursday after suffering 
an apparent heart attack, 
were held at 4 p.m. Sunday 
in Bell-Seale Funeral Home 
Chapel. 
The Rev. R. Virgil Mott 

officiated. Burial was in 
Snyder Cemetery. 
Born Dec. 21, 1933, in 

Belton, he married Betty Lee 
June 25, 1971, in Snyder. He 
was a truck driver. He was a 
Baptist. 
Survivors include his wife; a 

daughter, Debbie Provence 
of Houston; two sons, Collin 
of Plain Dealing, La., and 
Marty of Ruston, La.; two 
stepsons, Johnny Lee of Ris-
ing Star and Kenneth of the 
home; two stepdaughters, 
Leatha and Darla, both of the 
home; his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Loring Wiseman of 
Ville Platte, La.; three 
sisters, Mrs. H.O. Wilson 
and Mrs. Donald Clark, both 
of Ville Platte, and Mrs. Joe 
Padgett of Paris, Ky.; a 
brother, I.W. Jr. of Belton; 
and two grandchildren. 

George Kendrick 

THE TERMITE 

• Monthly or Annual Contracts 

• Termite Estimates 

• Tree and Yard Spraying 

George C. Kendrick, 79, of 
Rising Star died at 4:15 p.m. 
Thursday in a Bangs nursing 
home following a lengthy 
illness. Services were held S 
p.m. Saturday in Higgin-
botham Funeral Chapel. 
The Rev. Vernon McGinn of 

the Full Gospel Church 
officiated assisted by A.M. 
Fox. Burial was in Rising 
Star Cemetery. 
Born Oct. 2, 1898, in 

Henderson, Mr. Kendrick 
married Jessie J. Fox on May 
5, 1933, in Lovington, N.M. 
He was a retired farmer. Mr. 
Kendrick was a member of 
the Baptist church. 
Mrs. Kendrick died April 3, 

1972. 
Survivors include three 

sons, George Jr. of Sulphur, 
La., Jimmy of Graham and 
Sammy of Alice; five 
daughters, Mrs. Roy 
Markham of Cross Plains, 
Mrs. Alvis Williams and 
Mrs. Larry Bowman, both of 
Bangs, and Mrs. Frank 
Thornton, both of Comanche; 
a sister, Mamie Irby of 
Baytown; 28 grandchildren; 
and five great-grand-
children. He also was 
preceded in death by a son, a 
brother, two sisters, two 
grandchildren and one great-
grandchild. 

baked by Mrs. Trudi Long. 
Out of town guests in at-

tendance were: Mr. and Mrs. 
Ted Shook Jr. of Anaheim, 
California; Bill and Bertha 
Gant of Warren; Marie 
White, Lisa and John Paul 
McLaughlin of Fort Worth; 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Reid of 
Silsbee; James and Alta 
Gardner of Scranton; Don 
and Vicki Long of Fort 
Worth; Mr. and Mrs. J. M. 
Shook of Wichita Falls and 
Mr. and Mrs. Harley Long of 
Robert Lee. 

Ninety- nine people were 
on hand Sunday, July 9th to 
help Mr. and Mrs. M. H. 
White celebrate their golden 
wedding anniversary. The 
reception was hosted in their 
home by the White's 
daughter and family, Joe 
and Patsy Nixon of Angleton. 

Guests were served punch 
and cake by Charlene 
Schaefer, Sue Gardner, 
Dorothy Whiteside, Pam 
Mahan, Renee Nixon, Cindy 
Nixon and Barbara Long. 
The beautiful cake was 

Cross Plains, Texas 
Daytime: 725-7232 

Coleman, Texas: 
Phone: 62S-2389(00y or Night) 

* Pests * Lawn & Ornamentals * Weeds * Termites 

-GOOD TIME TO BUY- 
Sweetwater 41% Cake & Meal, 

and other feeds. 
Winfrey Feed & Peanut Co. 

Phone 643-6251 

Thursday, July 20, 1978 

Top quarity replace- 

ment parts for cars 

and trucks. 

Cross Plans Auto Supply 

833 Nkin St. 
Ph. 7254212 

Cen-Tex Real Estate 
Jerry Mahaffey- Broker 	Johnnie Watson 

• Carbon 639- 2367 	 Gorman 734- 2777 

3 bedroom, 2 bath, 1600 sq. ft., large 
closets, carport.. Convenient to downtown 
Eastland. $13,800 

Real neat, 1 bedroom house in Gorman. 
Ideal for young couple. $7,000 

4 bedroom, 3 bath brick- 215 S. Fisher-
Gorman. Fireplace, storm doors and 
windows, new carpet, ceramic cook- top, 
dishwasher, 7 walk- in closets. 3300 square 
feet of comfort. $44,800 or assume low 
equity loan. 

2 bedroom rock house on S. Fisher-
Gorman. Separate dining room, pecan 
trees, large lot. $15,000 

2 bedroom on N. Kent- Gorman- Ceramic 
tile bath, and cabinet tops, new plumbing, 
screened breezeway, carpet and hardwood 
floors. $15000 

4 bedroom, carpet and paneled, large, 
corner lot, new kitchen, garden spot. 
Gorman $19,500 

3,150 square feet of living area in this 
brick and redwood- large den- fireplace-
new carpet- FHA small down payment 
Gorman 37,500 

84 acres 5 miles east of Gorman- 38 acres 
in peanut allotment and 25 acres in coastal 
$37,800 

2 lake lots on Lake Granbury- Comanche 
Harbor addition- $4,000 total- terms with 
owner available. 

45 acres with moder 3 bedroom house in 
Kokomo community 39,750 

100 acres West of Gorman, 30 acres 
peanut allotment. Hwy. 6 frontage co- op 
water 

300 acres, good pasture, excellent hun-
ting for deer and turkey. Several tanks 
good fences, and cross fences, real good 3 
bedroom house, $380.00 

We appreciate your listing. 

Sister Of Ray 

Agnew Expires 

".••••••••11,  

Roberta Clark, 67, died 3:30 
a.m. Tuesday at the Bal-
linger Nursing Home 
following a lengthy illness. 
Services were held at 10 a.m. 
Wednesday at the Rotan 
Church of Christ. 
Charles Lindley of the 

Church of Christ officiated. 
Burial was in Rotan 
Cemetery, directed by 
Weathersbee Funeral Home. 
Born Oct. 19, 1910, in 

Lubbock, Mrs. Clark was the 
daughter of the late Mr. and 
Mrs. H.C. Burrus. She 
married O.R. Clark June 26, 
1931, in Abilene. She moved 
to Fisher County in 1932, 
moved to Snyder in 1971 and 
moved to Ballinger in 1975. 
She was a member of the 
Church of Christ. She was 
also active in the Eastern 
Star. 
Mr. Clark died July 20. 

1970. 
Survivors include a son, 

Bobby of Harrah, Okla.; a 
daughter. Mrs. Alvin Nitsch 
of Ballinger; four sisters. 
Mrs. Ray Agnew of Rising 
Star. Mrs. Claude Fletcher of 
Marble Falls. Mrs. Corabell 
Casey and Mrs. Hampton 
Herbert. both of Baytown; 
six grandchildren; and one 
great-grandchild. 

Services Held For 
Mother Of Iris 

Winchester 

Lessie Costin. 87, of 
Colorado City, died at 2:37 
p.m. Saturday at Root 
Memorial Hospital in 
Colorado City after a brief 
illness. Services were held at 
10 a.m. Monday at First 
United Methodist Chruch. 
The Rev. Bob Ford, pastor, 

officiated. Burial was in the 
Colorado Cemetery, directed 
by Kiker-Seale Funeral 
Home. 
Born Jan. 29, 1891, in 

Houston County, she came to 
Mitchell County in 1905 and 

YOUR NEW FORD DEALER 
78 Lincoln Cont. 4 dr., Town Car, fully loaded, Dove Gray 

78 T-Bird Diamiond Jubilee, Moon roof & everything else 
78 L.T.D. Landau 4 dr., 460 V-8 & Fully Loaded. 
78 Fairmont Station Wagon. 
78 Pinto with Hatch back-(Demo). 
78 Mustang Loaded. 
78 Granada's (2 others on the way). 
78 Pickups include 1/2  & 3/4  Ton, Automatics, 4 spds., 

Super Cabs, etc., in stock & more coming. 
78 2,3, & 5 Ton Trucks in stock. 

FORD JOHNSTON TRUCK &SUPPLY 
817-725-6181 Cross Plains 
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