
Phillip Teitel, Age 101/2  yrs. 
Father: Edward Teitel of Oak 
Park, Michigan. 
Mother: Laura Shearrow of 
San Antonio. 
Grandmother: Roxie 
Shearrow of Brownwood. 
Grandfather: Herbert 
Shearrow of Canton, Ohio. 
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Morris DeLong, Bill Easley Speaker. Rex Kiker 

In looking torward my 
greatest desire is that I shall 
not grow bitter and critical. I 
have known old people all my 
life who yearned for 'the 
good old days' and deplored 
that the young people. with 
things so easy. were going to 
the dogs. Young people do 
not have it easy today and 
they are not going to the 
dogs. Some individuals are, 
but they are traveling the 
road made smooth and paved 
by their counterparts of my 
generation. 
I have had the great plea-

sure of counselling with 
young people in recent weeks 
who are seeking God's will as 
diligently as I ever did. And 
they will find it, too. They 
will bless this world with 
their lives in a far greater 
capacity than I ever 
dreamed. 

is 

%I  Ruth Cowan Smith 

SENIOR CITIZEN OF THE 

Ruth Smith has devoted her 
entire life to service in the 
three institutions ordained 
and established by God: the 
home, the school, and the 
church. In fact, the three 
services have, often, over-
lapped, for it has been her 
joy to teach childre--the 
future builders of home, 
communities and nations--
developing both intellectual 
and spiritual qualities within 
them. 
It is a rare individual who 

concerns herself so openly, 
and so constantly, with the 
well-being of others. Ruth 
Smith CARES. Her faith in 
God is a very real trait, which 
has brought enriched fulfill-
ment in her life. And she has 
joyously given of herself, as 
she has pointed others to her 
Lord, that they, too, might 
discover that same peace and 
joy. 
Ruth is hospitality chairman 

of the Senior Citizens' Club; 
a more able ome could not 
have been selected. She has 
introduced so many fine 
speakers, and brought pro-
grams many larger clubs 
would have been happy to 
boast of. She has plans for 
much more. Anyone who has 
been 	missing 	these 
meetings, should resolve, 
now, to correct that error, 
and be present for every one 
of them in the future! 
It would be impossible to 

enumerate the many benefits 
Ruth brought to our town, 
when she and her family 
moved here. It was indeed, a 
fortunate day when they 
decided to settle here. We 
are grateful for their coming; 
we are happy to call them our 
own. 

The McKinnernry Band Tommy Pernell, Mildred Childers, 
Mark Cooksey, Jaunita Boyett 

New Officers Installed At Chamber Banquet 
A very dissapointing crowd 

attended the Annual Rising 
Star Chamber of Commerce 
banquet. Approximately 75 
people assembled for the 
event which was highlighted 
by Rex Kiker, Head of 
Communications at Abilene 
Christian University. Those 
who didn't attend, missed 
one of the best speakers 
Rising Star has had in the 
past years. He told a most 
delightful story about one of 
his relatives, Mable Wood. 

extended a cordial welcome 
to everyone present and 
introduced out of town 
guests. 
President, Tommy Pernell 

introduced the guest 
speaker. 
Don Boyett, local post-

master gave the introduction 
of new officers for the 1979 
year. Officers are: 
President--Tommy Pernell; 

Vice-president—Mark Cook-
sey; Secretary--Mildred 
Childers 	 and 

The decoration committee 
comprised of Kay Barker, 
Peggy Dennard and Helen 
May did a beautiful job, 
accenting the Valentine's 
Day theme. 
Mike Wiggins, minister of 

the Church of Christ brought 
the invocation. 
The Bar-B-Que dinner was 

catered by Heibner Bar-B-
Que of San Saba. 
Travis Williams, manager 

of West Texas Utilities 

Juanita 	Boy ett . 	New 
directors are Morris DeLong, 
Bill Easley, Gerald Jones, 
John Lee and James Ruther- 
ford. 

The entertainment was 
provided 	by 	the 
McKinnerney Band. 
Everyone thoroughly enjoy 
the toe tapping music. 
The benediction was 

delivered by Bill Easley, 
pastor of the First United 
Methodist Church. 

City Gas Purchases Continue Downward Trend 
percent more gas than we 
need. 

Many citizens have been 
inconvenienced during the 
installation of the new gas 
system. This was un-
derstandable, but regret-
table. City officials and 
employees have worked 
hard, the officials without , 
their customary pay, and we 

are proud to have had a part 
in it. We know that a better 
job could have been done by 
"experts." The experts did 
not volunteer their services, 

Our gas system is 
adequate and is doing the 
job. For this, we as City 
officials and employees 
derive satisfaction. 

THE MAYOR 

Mail Service To Iran Suspended 
Mrs. H.L. Killion 
Named Mental 
Health Chairman 

civil mail bound for Iran 
until further notice. Mail 
currently in the postal 
system destined for Iran will 
be returned because of the 
suspension of service. 

Chamberlain 

was to pitch hay. I could do 
that if I had to but I really do 
not care to learn. 
By the time I finished high 

school we were living in New 
Mexico and in the depth of 
depression. There was no 
human way for me to go to 
college which was my 
greatest desire. There was 
nothing for me to do by stay 
home and help with the 
younger children. 
There were three very 

frustrating years of this. But 
I had given my heart to God 
and during these three years 
I gave my entire life to my 
family and my church. I felt 
God wanted me in full time 
Christian service and I tried 
to turn it all over to Him. I 
found then, as I have so 
many times since, he works 
in mysterious and wonderful 
way. The things i %vas doing 
seemed so little and insigni-
ficant but it was my willing-
ness to do what I could that 
came to the attention of Rev. 
S.K. McCollough and 
through him I was granted a 
scholarship to Wayland 
College at Plainview, Texas. 
That gave the opportunity I 

needed to get into college but 
it didn't supply the necessi-
ties of life. When I left for 
college my father gave me 
the last three dollars he had. 
But of course the Lord was 
there ahead of me. A young 
ministerial couple, the E.L. 
Reddens, needed help in 
their home. Mrs. Redden 
was confined to her bed and 
unable to do her work or care 
for her two children. I could 
do that so I lived with them, 
did the house work, cared for 
the children, and went to 
school. The Reddens were a 
difficult time so our mutual 
need brought us together in 
close bonds of Christian 
friendship and fellowship. 
They were great Christians 
and added much to my faith 
and the deepening of my 
spiritual life. Our friendship 
has spanned the years. Bro. 
Redden went to his reward 
last September. 
My college grades were not 

as high as my high school 
grades had been but with 
God's help I came out with a 
good strong B average for 
which I was very thankful. 
The greatest compliment I 
ever received in my life was 
paid to me the day I received 
by diploma at Wayland. Mrs. 
George McDonald. the wife 
of Wayland's president put 

New operators of the truck 
Stop Restaurant are Melvin 
and Marie Lunceford. They 
assumed operation Friday, 
February 16th from Kyle 
Simonton. They will be open 
seven days a week and will 
be open 24 hours a day. 
The Lunceford's extend a 

cordial invitation to everyone 
to come out and eat with 
them. 

Suspension of civilian mail 
service to Iran has been 
extended to covered surface 
mail, the U. S. Postal Service 
announced today. The effect 
is to eliminate all civilian 
mail service between Iran 
and the United States. 

Airmail service to trans 
was suspended January 9, 
1979. 

Postal officials said the 
latest action was taken 
because of the lack of 
reliable air and surface 
transportation either in or 
out of that country. 

The suspension means no 
U. S. post office will accept 

$1,142.58. 
The City furnishes gas to 

the City Hall, the library, the 
medical 	clinic, 	the 
Greynolds heirs and the 
Senior Citizens building at no 
cost. This is free gas. 

This grest improvement 
made in the gas system has 
kept the City from 
bankruptcy. We are catching 
up on our outstanding debts 
and by June 30, can have 
them all °aid. 

We still have the gas 
stystem to pay for but we are 
not delinquent in paying for 
it. Our delinquent bills are 
mostly for gas purchased in 
1976, 1977, and 1978. We still 
owe $33,000.00 for this gas. 
We have, however, reduced 
it from $58,000.00 on January 
1, 1979. 

We must continue to im-
prove the effeciency of our 
gas system. In doing this, we 
can improve the City's 
services to its customers and 
in time reduce gas rates 
charged t to them. 

Should we ever let the new 
system deteriorate as we 
allowed the old system to do, 
then we will face bankruptcy 
again. The City cannot 
financially servive should we 
ever again have to buy 55 

Rising Star bought 
8,615,000 Cubic feet of 
natural gas in January, 1979. 
This compares with 
13,294,000 Cubic feet of gas 
bought in January 1978. A 
fifty four per cent im-
provement has been made. A 
result of installation of new 
gas p pipeline and in im-
porved metering. 

This outstanding ac-

complishment is tut 
reduction of gas looses due to 
leakage in the old system. 
Only 3 per cent more gas was 
bought than could be ac-
counted f for. 
The City billed its 

customers for 8,091,000 cubic 
feet of gas in January and 
278,000 cubic feet of gas was 
metered for which no charge 
was made, ( free gas). Only 
246.000 cubic feet of gas 

could not be accounted for, 
( a three per cent loss. 

Natural gas is bought and 
sold by the thousand cubic 
feet ( MCF). The City paid 
$2.01 per MCF in January 
and sold it to its customers 
for $4.11. 

The total cost to the City 
for January was $17,316.15 
and $33.255.01 was billed to 
the customers. Free gas was 
metered and valued at 

By Elizabeth 

Note: The following account 
was written by Ruth Smith, 
and, with her persmission, I 
hereby submit it for publica-
tion just as she gave it to me. 
It is my belief that any 
alterations I might have 
made in it would simply have 
detracted from its beauty. I 
do add a few thoughts at the 
close of hers. 

--E.C. 
I was born Ruth Cowan, 

third in the family of twelve, 
in 1915. My birthplace was a 
log cabin in Hays County 
built by my maternal grand-
father for his bride whom he 
had met on a wagon train 
from North Carolina soon 
after the Civil War. 
One of my earliest 

memories is a long purple 
pencil my father gave me. It 
was one of the most wonder-
ful gifts I ever received.'With 
this pencil and a Playmates 
Primer, which had belonged 
to my oldest sister, who 
died two months before my 
birth, I trailed my mother's 
every step demanding help. I 
am sure I tried her patience 
to the limit but I was born 
with an insatiable desire to 
learn. Anyway, long before I 
started to school I could read 
and write. 
My family owned three 

books: the Bible, a 
dictionary, and the Primer. I 
think those are the basis for a 
good education. With a Bible 
and a dictionary any one can 
teach himself if he cares to 
learn. I have never outgrown 
my desire to learn. I can't 
imagine a subject that 
couldn't interest me. I don't 
like filth but I'll read any 
thing that is well written and 
informative. What's more I 
enjoy it. 
During my early school 

years I attended one and two 
room schools. My father was 
a tenant farmer and we 
moved often so I attended 
many schools. One of these 
was the Albert School were 
President Johnson had 
attended. 
We had little of this world's 

goods but we had love and 
we knew it. Growing up with 
a large family without a lot of 
money may not sound 
interesting to some but we 
never had a dull moment and 
certainly learned to depend 
on ourselves for our needs 
and entertainment. That has 
served me well throughout 
my life. The only thing, I 
think. I never did on the farm 

BRAG CORNER Beverly Nichols To Present Program 

To NARFE On Energy Conservation • 

Beverly Nichols will address 
the National Association of 
Federal Retired Employees 
(NARFE) Monday, February 
26th beginning at 2:45 p.m. 
in the Texas Electric Room in 
Eastland. Ruth Dunn, pro-
gram chairman made the 
announcement. Her topic 

will be "Operation Ltgnt 
Up", which will revolve 
around energy conservation. 
Following the program, the 

group will travel to the 
Ramada Inn where they will 
have dinner. 
All employees and their 

spouses are welcome, as are 
any visitors. 

BRAG CORNER 
Roy Butler Inducted 

Into Oklahoma Rough Neck's Club 

Mrs. H.L. Killion of Rising 
Star was named Mental 
Health Bellringer Chairper-
son for the May '79 
campaign announced Dick 
Fredrick, president of the 
Mental Health Association in 
Texas. 
"The Mental Health Asso-

ciation is comprised of 
citizens concerned about the 
quality of life in their 
communities. They are 
aware of the problems of the 
mentally ill -- the lack of 
treatment or information --
and have formed a statewide 
association to help solve 
these problems," said 
Fredrick. 
Current concerns of the 

Association include: 
community mental health 
center funding; mental 
health coverage in national 
health insurance; child care 
licensing; patient's rights 
and the impact of deinstitu-
tionalization. 
The Association utilizes a 

variety of information and 
education services in order to 
eliminate misconceptions, 
educate the general public 
about symptoms and 
encourage early detection 
and treatment of mental 
illness. 
Since the Mental Health 

Association in Texas is a 
non-profit volunteer agency, 
it must rely on private contri-
butions to continue working 
to promote mental health. 

Douglas Lee, age 7 yrs. 
PARENTS: Mr. and Mrs. 
Doc Bass of Benton, , 
Arkansas. 
Grandparents: Mr. and Mrs. 
Norman Hubbard of Rising 
Star. "Little minds are wounded 

by the smallest things," 
La Rochefoucauld 

her arms around me anu 
said, "Ruth we've never had 
a girl to come to Wayland 
and do what you have done." 
I didn't do it, of course. It 
was through the grace of God 
and the help of many won' 
derful people. 
One of those wonderful 

people was a young 
ministerial student by the 
name of Carl A. Smith who 
had asked me to share his' 
life. After teaching school 
one year we were married 
and continued to try to finish 
our education and serve in 
the place we felt we were 
called. 
Smith felt led to start work 

in unchurched areas and had 
begun this type of work while 
in Wayland. There were 
some rather difficult times. 
Ministerial students seldom 
have an easy time going to 
school but most look back ont 
hat time as one of happiest 
times of their lives. Our main 
problem was Smith's health. 
He had had to drop out of 
Wayland because of poor 
health. 
He finished his Academy 

work at San Marcos Baptist 
Academy six months after 
our daughter was born. We 
then went to Hardin 
Simmons and I taught at 
Hamlin for two years. I 
finally was able to get my 
degree from Hardin 
Simmons. But after ten years 
of battling the health 
problem Smith finally gave 
up hopes of finishing his 
education. We took jobs with 
Buckner Orphans Home in 
Dallas, Texas 1 taught and he 
worked on the dairy. 
The work there was a new 

experience for me. Having 
never known anything but 
love and help from those 
around me my heart melted 
for the children I taught 
there. After thirty years I still 
try when I think efisomacof 
those children. I had never 
known anyone to abandon 
their child. I knew it 
happened, of course, but 
there I came into close 
contact with the terrible 
consequences of sin. I am 
just glad it is not my respon-
sibility to punish parents who 
mistreat or neglect their 
children. 
It was that Christmas I 

received my most expensive 
gift. The children were given 
a nickle a week to spend on a 
treat. Four little boys pooled 
their nickles one week to buy 
me a Christmas gift-a little 
celluloid snow man. The 
price, nineteen cents, consti-
tuted one whole month's 
income. No one else has ever 
spent so much on a gift for 
me. 
But Smith was not content 

with working on a dairy. The 
Lord had called him to 
preach and nothing short of 
that would satisfy him. We 
resigned our jobs at Buckner 
and went to the First Baptist 

' Church of Urbandale to start 
a mission for them. Our 
Mission was located on 
Scyenre Road between 
Dallas and Mesquite. Smith 
started a visitation program. 
We held our first meeting in 
a tent with thirteen people 
present.. He continued visit-
ing. In cooperation with the 
Urbandale church and the 
Dallas Baptist Association 
we were able to erect a 
building and start a full 
program. I taught at Irving, 
to help out with expenses. 
When we left for Alaska 
three years later we were 
having seventy-five people in 
Sunday School and a stable 
foundation had been laid for 
a church. It became a church 
a few years later. 
About our sojourn in 

Alaska, if I could do it over 
again the only thing I would 
do differently is I'd go sooner 
and stay longer. But then 
just look at all the blessings I 
would have missed here. 
In retrospect many of the 

things we have attempted 
seem foolish and completely 
outside of the realm of 
reason and responsibility. 
My answer to that is: 
humanly speaking, they 
were. But the sanetst and 
most secure place to be and 
the most logical thing to do is 
to find God's will for your life 
and do as He leads. We tried 
that and have found it works. 
My advice to young people is 
to find God's will and go 
ahead. You will never go 
wrong doing that. >Pa 

honorary and is the most 
excluive club in oil and gas 
and to be inducted into a 
Roughneck's Club is one of 
the finest tributes given for 
services rendered. 

Roy is the son of Hazel 
Marsh and the late Tom 

Butler. 

Boy Butler, former Mayor 
of Ardmore, Oklahoma and 
now president of Noble 
Affiliates, inc., was inducted 
into the Oklahoma Rough 
Neck's Club at the Oklahoma 
Independent Petroleum 
Association Meeting in 
'Tulsa. This club is entirely 



CARPENTRY & 
CONSTRUCTION 

WORK-Residential & 
commercial. Remodeling, 

add-ons, new homes, 
custom cabinets, concrete 

9 electrical work, 
etc. 

HOLLIS WELLIAMS* 
442-1933 p-90 
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Dr. 
Ellis & Ellis 

Optometrist 
308 Citizens Nat'l Bank 

Building 
Brownwood, Texas 

GLASSES 
CONTACT LENSES 

Call 646- 8778 
or write, P.O. Box 149 

MORGANS CABINET 
SHOP 

STAR ROUTE 
CARBON TEXAS 
Phone 643-6517 

CUSTOM BUILT 
CABINETS 

Fast, Dependable 
Fin Developing' 
Palace Drug Store 

_ Rising Star, Texas 

•	 

STONE ETERNAL 
MEMORIALS: 

Seal and certificate see 
Mr. and Mrs. L.C. Free-
man representing Cole-
man Monument Works, 
Coleman, Texas. 

Phone 817-629-1631 
or see 305 N. Dixie, 

Eastland, Texas 76448 
T105 
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SHULTS REAL ESTATE 
Phone: 643-1904 Office 

or 643.3434 Home 
We have farm and ranch 

listings-but need more. 

•	 

FOR SALE: Dark Peanut 
Hay; in barn. Ph. 643-1904, 
business. Ph. 643-3434, home 
or call: Ph. 643-3431, Buck 
Clark. 	 8-2tc 

DAN'S GREENHOUSE 
All types vegetables. 
bedding and Pot Plants. 
Also all sizes and types of 
baskets. 

Open 9 a.m. to 8 p.m. 
7 Days Weekly 

7 Mi. East Hwy. 36, 11/2  
Mi. So. 

of Hwy. 36. 
Dan or Dell Hamer 

Rt. 2 
Rising Star, Tex. 76471 

FOR SALE or TRADE: John 
Deere 70 tractor. LP gas; 
Engine completely over-
hauled. (Man who had house 
in Cisco to trade, give me a 
call). Ph. 643-6872. 

NEED SOME EXTRA 
CASH? 

Sell me that extra car or 
pickup you don't really need. 
Will consider any model 
regardless of age that's good 
running and clean. Cleaner 
they are the more 	pay! No 
dogs or junkers please. 
Phone Rising Star (817) 643-
1372 Anytime except 
Sundays. 50-tfc 

NOTICE! 
A reward will be given to 

anyone who turns in at: The 
Rising Star office, a green 
leather key case containing 
car key and house key. 
Phone 643-4141. 	8-1TC 

WANTED: Applications 
are being accepted for 
Director of Nursing Ser-
vice at Cisco Nursing 
Center, 1404 Front Street, 
Cisco. Please apply in 
person. Position available 
immediately. Equal Opp- 
ortunity Employer. 	53 

WANTED: MILD STEEL 
FABRICATORS AND 
WELDERS with 2 years 
experience, between 8:00 
a.m. and 5:00 p.m., contact 
Ross Co. Brownwood, Tex. 
Call 915-646-7581, after 7:00 
p.m. call 915-646-3983. 

SHIP MERCHANTS: We will 
call for and deliver your 
freight within the city 
limits of Rising Star. Call 
725-7502 or 725-6133. 42 

616 OAK GROVE: 3 BDRM.; 
2 Baths; Living RM.; Comb. 
Kitchen and Dining Area; 14' 
x 14' Storage BLDG. and Car 
Port. $25000. with 10 percent 
down payment. Owner will 
finance. 
Have prospects for small 

acreage farms, houses and 
ranches. 

LOUIS. MAYFIELD 
BROKER 

Ph. 817-643-4073 

FOR SALE or TRADE: New 
24' by 86' Neckover Stock 
trailer W-removable Cattle 
Rack to convert to flatbed. 
ph. 643-6872. 

Franke's Pest Control 
Commercial and Residential 

Tree Spraying 
Weed Control 
Termite Spray 

General Pest Control 
State Licensed and 

Insured 
[Texas P.C. L. No. 2678] 

Ph. Cross Plains 
725-7232 
daytime 

Ph. Coleman, Tek. 
625-2389 

Day or night 
33tfc 

FOR SALE: Lot-176' hi-way 
frontage; 244' deep; Metal 
Bldg. 20 x 90'; 6 room house; 
all on same lot across from E. 
Odom's Motel. Owner: Eddy 
Petty Ph. 725-6113. 7-2TC 

HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS 
TRAILERS 

15 New 40 x 42 ft. Fontaine 
tandem flats. All have 
sliding tandems, 2 spd gears, 
ICC lights, flaps etc. Prices. 
start at $7,940. Also 9 new 
drop decks from 40 to 50 ft. 8 
new lowbeds 25 to 50 ton. 9 
used lobeds, 7 40 & 42 ft fits, 
dumps, water, grain, 
equipment, gooseneck, pole, 
van. & other trailers. 
Johnston Truck Cross 
Plains. Ph. 725-6181 

DIESEL & FORD 
MECHANICS 

We need one more good 
diesel & one more good Ford 
mechanic now. We have 
never been out of work in 21 
years in same location. If 
you dont like to work with 
some pretty nice people & 
live in a small town, paid 
vacations, paid major med 
ical Ins. itc. please dont 
waste our time & yours. 
Johnston Truck & Supply 
Cross Plains. Ph. 725-6181 

FORD F 150 VANS 
One Window Van, One Club 
Wagon & One New 78 with 2 
Captains, 2 bucket, one 
bench rear that makes bed, 
ice box, sink and water, full 
carpet, windows & much 
more & used Reg. gas. 
$11,225. Johnston Ford Cross 
Plains, Tex. Ph. 725-6181 

UNDER TRUCKS FOR 
SALE 

WINCH TRUCKS 
Super heavy duty Autocar 
with 3 335 Cummins 70 Tulsa 
winch, 24 ft oilfield rigup 
bed, a little old but it shore 
runs & looks very good. 

1972 Int. 4200 Transtar with 
M 18 Bradeie, 5th wheel, 
rolling tail, twin screw, 
40,000 miles on 318 major. 
This is a very goad one. 

1970 C 0 Mack winch, 5th 
wheel, rolling tail, 318 Det., 
10 spd, Looks and runs good. 

1966 Chev 2 ton, winch, 
bed, roller etc. 1 Old Mack 
single axle oilfield rigup tk. 
Johnston Truck Cross 
Plains, Tex. 725-6181 

CARS 
NEW LINCOLN 

MARKS & 4 
DOORS 

2 New Mark V & 2 new 4 door 
Town Cars, All are fully 
loaded & $2,100. discount for 
cash. Johnston Truck & 
Supply 725-6181 Cross Plains, 
Tex. Plenty of Ford Cars, 
pickups, trucks, Vans & 78 
Cont. 4 4 door Town Car 
almost like new. Call Now. 

TRUCKS 
27 Diesel TRUCKS 

Tandems & singles, Conv. & 
cabovers. We have um in 
stock Johnston Truck Cross 
Plains, Tex. 725-6181. 

Orchards, Peanut Farms, 
Timber Land and Retirement 
Places. 
Selling Central Texas For 

the Past 20 Years. 
COGBURN REALTY 

DELEON, TEXAS 76444 
5-2tc 

FOR SALE: 76 Ford 3/4 ton 
4-door P.U. with power 
steering and brakes, Air, 
Cruise control, auto. Reg. 
gas, new tires and small 
camper. Would take trade on 
part of asking price. Ph. 
643-6872. 

410"*************IF • 
* WANTED MILD STEEL 

FABICATORS AND * 
* WELDERS with 2 years 
* experience, between 8:00 0-
* a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Cont- 
* act Ross Co. Brownwood. 
* Tex., call 915-646-7581, 4. ..„  

after 7:00 p.m. call 915- 
646-3983. 	 t5 
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INTRODUCING 
Bobby Brummett and! 

Johnny Frago for State 
wide consultants in crime 
prevention /detection 
systems for resendential, 
commercial, schools, etc. 
State license No. B-2076 
Financing available. For 
your protection Informa-

1  lion contact locally 
MRS. ORA BRUMMETT 

647-1402 
firs: 7:30 a.m.-6:00 p.m. 

tic 
p 

p 

FOR SALE: Coastal Hay. 
Call: 643-4583, Jerry Davis 
after 5 p.m. on weekdays or 
anytime on weekends. 7-tic 
FOR SALE: Dark Peanut 
Hay; 'in Barn. Phone 643-
1904, bus. or Ph. 643-3434, 
res. or call Buck Clark 643- 
3431. 	 7-2TC 
FOR SALE: Registered 
Brahman cattle; 15 grey 
bulls ages from 10 mos. to 2 
years. Also a few grey 
yearling heifers. Contact: 
Rodney C. Stephens 208 N. 
Tex. St. De Leon, Texas 
76444 Phone 817-893-6711, 
Bus. or 817-893-6766, Rex. 7- 

RESPONSIBLE PERSON 

Wanted to own and operate 
candy of Horoscope vending 
route. Rising Star and 
surrounding area. Pleasant 
business. High profit items. 
Can start part time. Age or 
experience not important. 
Requires car and $1495 to 
$4995 cash investment. For 
details write and include 
your phone number: 

FOR SALE or TRADE: REG. 
HORSE, 	"LEROY 
GEORGE"; 21 mo. sorrel' 
stallion; Little Joe and King 
P234 BLOODLINES. Ph. 643-
6872. 

HOME REPAIR 
SERVICE 

Carpentry-curbing 
fencing-painting 

no charge for estimates 
442.3136 or 442-1370 

-230Cairlinin 
Lake Leon. tree covered, 
water front property with 
1100 sq. ft. cabin. Central 
heat and air, fireplace and 
city water. 80 ft. lighted 
dock. Completely furnished 
including washer 323.000-
call 817-268-4223. 

eating area; Front and back 
porches screened; Fruit 
trees; City water; % acre. 

SIDING: 
Solid Vinyl, Storm 

Windows, Doors, Re- 

placement Windows, 
Aluminum Screens and 
House Leveling, Roofs 
and Remodeling. 
D&E HOME IMPROVE-

MENT CO. 
BOX 623, RISING STAR, 

TEXAS 76471 
PH. 817-643-3606. 

37 

Eagle Industries 
3938 Meadowbrook Road 
Minneapolis, Minn. 55426 

FOR SALE: Firewood by the 
pickup load. You gather. 
$17.50. Ph. 643-6872. 
FOR SALE: Portable color 
TV; Gooseneck trailer dual 
tandem axle; International 8 
wheel amphibian; Misc. Also 
buy junk cars and junk iron. 
Can see at Corner of Miller 
and Mills St. 8-2TC 

We have qualified buyers 
for land in this area. If you 
are interested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

1 BLOCK WEST OF 
SCHOOL ON COMANCHE 
ST.---May, Texas. 	PH. 
259-2421 

FOR SALE: 77 Chevrolet Van 
call 629-1835 after 5:00 p.m. 
or 629-2012. 

WANTED: 
011 and Gas Leases 
Ph. 817-725-6445, Guy 
Stroud 
P.O. Box 158 
Cross-Plains, Texas 76443 
4-4te 

NOTICE: Applications are 
now being accepted at 
Cisco Nursing Center for 
LVNs and aides for all 
shifts. Please contact 

We have qualified 
buyers for land in this 
area. If y ou are in-
terested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

3434 North 6th St. 
Office Phone 673- 2371. 

Alvin Hackfeld 692- 9597 
Venita Raymond 692-

5244 

HELP WANTED: Builders 
and Builders Helpers will 
train-apply at Morgan's 
Bldg. in Eastland. T16 

Jimmy Partin 
Insurance 

And Realty Co. 

FOR SALE: Square Oak 
dining table with six chairs 
and two leaves. Ph. 817-643-
1344. 7-tfc 

---.-----
Burmuda Grass Sprigging. 

Ph. 643-3137. 7-tic 

FOR SALE: 1976 Olds Delta 
88 Royal 4 door hard top 
34,000 miles one owner car 
like new 18 miles per gal. 
Priced for quick sale 629-
2083 or 629-2022. 

NOTICE Gooseneck 
hauling and day work. 
Also cattle 	bought and 
sold. Call Charlie For-
stenberry 725- 6607 
(Pioneer) or 725- 6307. 
51- tfc r 

DAVID FENTER 
LICENSED PLUMBER 
AND REMODELING 

CONTRACTOR 
647.1970 

Specializing In 
residential plumbing 

3434 North 6th St. 
Office Phone 673 - 2371 

FOR SALE: 1970 Lincoln 
Contiltlia 4 door Sudan 
loaded good condition really 
good tires $1150 Can be seen 
at 200 W. Commerce East-
land 629-2022 or 629-2083. 

GREEN THUMB ALERT 

FOR SALE: 1967 Ford 
Custom 500 automatic, 
power steering, air $500.00 
Call 442-3417. T13 

WANTED 
NOTICE 

Carpet cleaning- heavy 
shampoo followed by cold 
water rinse, extractor 
removes all dirt into barrel. 

Is your carpet flooded? 
Have machine to remove or 
extract water from carpet. 
References in Rising Star. 
Phone D.T. Boyd (915- 356-
2454. 52- tfn 

Alvin Hackfeld 692 - 9597 
Venita Raymond 692 - 5244 

NOTICE: Taking applicat-
ions-Reliable, strong clean-
ing lady once or twice 
weekly. References. Call 
629-2413. 

FOR SALE: 1976 Ford 
Custom 500 automatic, 
power steering, air $500. Call 
442-3417. T12 

WANTED 
TO LEASE 

Pasture for appr. 10 homes 
with barn close to town. 

PH. 643-8872 

4 acres, greenhonse,mo- 
bile home. Mobile home 
can go with property or: 
not. Commercial ;•po-' 
tential-retall or whole- 
sale. Eastland ',imam. 
Mary Youvonne McMillan 

104 East 8th 
Cisco, Texas 

442-3846 
p-tfc 

me. 

THE 

POODLE PALACE WANTED 
5 H.P. Briggs and STRAT-
TON engine for Wizard roto; 
Doesn't have to work. PH. 
643-6872 

NOTICE-Insulate your home 
with Mastic Solid vinyl siding 
and Reynolds storm 
windows. For free estimate 
call S&M Supply Co., Cisco, 
442-2077. 

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 
Modern Motel off 1-20 in 
excellent condition, nice 
living quarters. Priced 
under $85,000. write Ben 
Fisher 3434 North 6th 
Abilene, Tx., 79603 or call 
915473-4234. T12 

FOR SALE: 1972 Bulck 
Electra-4 door custom hard 
top-beautiful shade of 
green-black vinyl top. 
1970 Olds. 98-4-door 

sedan 	loaded 	with 
locally owned. 
1969 Delta 88 4 door 

sedan-one owner car, 
excellent condition. 
1966 Plymoth Fury Sedan 4 

door. 
Call 629-2022 or 629-2083 in 

Eastland. 
We'll sell you a new car, 

any make or model, and save 

NOTICE: I do babysitting by 
the hour, Ph. 643-2794. 7-2TC 

Kay Lamb 

Jeanne Rains 

No tranquilizers used 
All patterns and breeds 
Monday through Saturday 
442.1689 or 442-3406 
Special rates for standing 
oppointments. 
Highway 80 West next to 
Chat & Curl Beauty 
Salon. 

FOR SALE: 77 Chevette 
20,000 miles good gas mile 
excellent condition 52500 
442-3417 after 6 p.m. 

WANTED: Live caught 
Babies and adult raccoon; 
Fox; others, Reptiles. Open 
every Thursday weekly. 10 
am. till dark. Located west 
67-84. Pass car lot, turn 
south. Follow signs. Trap-
ping supplies. Stanley 
Critters Brownwood. 5-4tc 

ne ! 

Do you really get a 
Bala need diet? Let me tell 
you about Dr. Shaklee's 
Food Supplements, Try 
Dr, Shaklee's Slim and 
Trim PLAN. 

We also carry natural 
food supplements, con-
centrated bio-degradable 
household cleaners, 
natural skin care 
products, toiletries and 
baby products. 
BARBARA JO KANADY 
SHAKLEE DISTRIBU-

TOR 
Phone 643-5791 after 6 
p.m. 

CARD 
OF THANKS 

NOTICE!! 
Lose weight fast, new 

"Coffee-Break" cubes turns 
coffee into powerful appetite 
suppressant - Reduce safely 
with Dex•A-Diet II once a day 
capsules, Palace Drug. 
4-5TP 

FOR SALE: Drive a little 
save a lot on your mobile 
home. Double wide and 
singles; several to choose 
from. Eastland direct factory 
outlet. Interstate 20, Olden, 
Texas Ph. 817-653-2432 FHA 
financing and conventional. 
41-tic 

HELP -7 

WANTED  

NOTICE-We buy sell or 
Trade Quality Cameras 
any and all types of 35mm 
or larger. No Kodaks or 
Polarolds 205 S. Lamar 

.629-2682 Steven Printing 
& thotography.  tf 

( CARD 
OF THANKS   

We are sending a letter 
because a mere few words 
won't express all that we are 
feeling right now. 
The things that you all did 

to show your love and 
concern at our son's death 
touched us deeply. You 
never even met Kelly--most 
of you--so. we know you did 
these things because of your 
love for us. Meeting us at the 
cemetery. sending food to 
Mama's house, and the 
many cards and telephone 
calls we have all received 
have helped to comfort more 
than you can know. Please 
know how much we love you 
in return and accept our 
deepest gratitude. "OH! The 
Dear Hearts and Gentle 
People Who Live In Our 
Home Town."---- 

Hershel and Margie Kent 
and Family 

Mrs. Sam Jones and Family 
Mrs. Emma Kent and Family 

FOR SALE: New and used 
trailers. New 6 x 20 and 6 x 32 
Dugan gooseneck trailers. 24 
ft. Flatbed Dugan, and 16 ft. 
bumper flatbed, New Hale 
trailers. Used 14 ft. Hale 
trailer. 6 x 16 metal top 
gooseneck trailer. 817-442-
2304. 4 

Want To Buy 
Bred Cows 

Please Contact 
V.H. Funk 

[817]442-5381 
T16 

HELP WANTED 
FEMALE--Mature lady to 
operate ice cream parlor and 
snack bar in Ranger, Texas. 
Weekly salary, room ane 
board available. Call or write 
Bob Harris, 817-647-3129, 
P.O. Box 298, Ranger, Texas 
76470. 

I would like to take this 
opportunity to thank all of my 
friends for the many words of 
encouragement, cards, 
flowers, phone calls and 
visits while I was in West 
Texas Medical Center. 
Thanks for your concern 

and may God bless each of 
you always. 

Joe Butler 

Long Branch Polled Hereford 
Palled •Hereford Breeding 
Bulls for Sale. Limplighters 
and Victor Domino bloodline. 
Few heifers for sale. Call 
643-4437. 	 t28 

NOTICE 
Income tax preparation, 

W-2, quarterly and 
annual reports, bookkeep-
ing, experienced tax 
acceuntant. Zella Erwin 
[Mrs. W.R. Erwin] I 
Phone 725-6156. 1-ltc 

FOR SALE: Coastal Bur-
muda Sprigging Ph. 643-3137, 
R. L. ( Bob) Rust 	8-tic 

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 
Modern Motel off 1-20 in 
excellent condition, nice 
livng room quarters. Priced 
under $85,000. Write Ben 
Fisher 3434 North 6th 
Abilene, Tx. 79603 call 915-
673-4234. T12 

1: • • III • * 
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BUDDY COOK 
Residential and 

Commercial 
refrigeration and 

plumbing 
Ph. 817.842-5950 

Rising Star, Texas 76471 
32-4TC 	_ _ _ _ 

FOR SALE 1973 Buick 
Electra Limited, hard top 
coupe, every accessory that 
Buick offers, low mileage. 
Drives and runs like new. 
Call 629-2083 or come by and 
see at 202 W. Commerce. 

FOR SALE: Motorola 
2-way radios. FInancining 
Av ailab le. Low cost 
communications for small 
b usinesses, farmers and 
ranchers. Call 915-646-
8003 1111 Ave. W., 
Brownwood, Tx. 	1105 

OUTSIDE SALE:, Olden, 
Tex., one mile east of Post 
Office on right every Fri. and 
Sat. Savings on lots of new 
items, Jewlery, tools, 
buckles, knives, books, toys, 
paint, hammer handles, 
wrought iron and plaster 
from mexico and furniture. 
We buy old coins, furniture 
and appliances call 653-2259. 

t8 

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Shug Colwell 

would like to express our 
deep appreciation for all the 
kindness shown us in the loss 
of our loved one. To Bro. 
Williams Ray Daniels, Mrs. 
Easley, our pallbearers, the 
ladies who provided lunch at 
the Baptist Church and for 
the f food brought to our 
home, the beautiful flowers 
and cards, a very special 
Thank You! 

Mr. and Mrs. Clinton 
Wilson and Family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Bennett and 
Family and Mr. Tommy 
Culviell. 	 8-11? 

FOR SALE 

We buy aluminum cans, 
crushed or uncrushed. 17 
cents a lb. Call 647-1236. 
T12 
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Commercial Printing- Hale Dunson 

OPSOSSAvalndralISSA 
CAROLYN 'RATLIFF 

INCOME TAX SERVICE 
Phone 643-6464 

Rising Star 
3-3 Mos. 

SitdratrarairSearsar  

PLUMBING 
PROBLEMSCaII Hut-

chens Plumbing Co. for 
dependable and reliable 
service, reasonable rates. 
Water heaters also sold 
and installed. Licensed 
and Bonded. 

442- 3803 
LEWIS HUTCHENS 

Rt. 2 Box 70 
Cisco, Texas  

1972 Buick Electra Custom 4 
door hard. Looks and runs 
like new. Sell at or below 
market value. 629-2083 or 
629-2022. 

'78 Ford 150 XLT Ranger 
Lariat, last of the pickups 
that burn regular gas, has 2 
gas tanks, must sell due to 
health, 7,000 actual miles, 
heavy duty rear bumper and 
fiberglass shell, maybe seen 
in Gorman call 817-734-2418. 
114 

Clausen Oil Company, 
Inc. 

Conoco and Mobil 
Products 

Office: 817-725-6582 
Home: 817.6434836 
Al & Billie Clausen 

P.O. Box 416 
Cross Plains, Tex. 

76443 
33-dc 

• 

• 

* 
• 

• 

-CISCO-EASTLANO;ARANGER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES:By carrier in city, 30 cents a 

week or 90 cents a month: $10.60 a year; one year by mail in 
county, $7.00; City P.O. Boxs $7.00; one year elsewhere in 
state, $10.00 out of state $12 year. 

RISING STAR SUBSCRIPTION RATES: By 
mail in Eastland and Adjoing Counties: $4.00 per • 
year: in Texas, $5.00 per lyear: elsewhere is :U.S.. 
and foreign counties, $8.00 per year. 

** * * 

Shop WM/ Mobile Homes 
Hwy. 180 E. Brecken-
ridge. All sizes offered 14 
a 56 thru 14 a 80 Financ-
ing available. Call 817-
5554142. 

1968 Chevrolet Station 
wagon unusually nice and 
clean, good tires, battery, 
and air conditioner, Runs 
and looks good $585.00. 629-
2083 or 629-2022. 

JOHNSON & SON 
Water Wells-Shallow Oil 
Test holes-Core drilling 

Tim, Jr.--Tim Sr. 
Ph. 752-7168, Bangs, Tex. 
Ph. 643-3424, Rising Star, 
, 	Star, Tea. 

33-mini 

1969 Olds. Delta 88 4 door 
Sudan, exceptionally nice 
5685.00. 629-2083 or 
629-2022. 

SEWER ROOTER 
SERVICE 

See Jack or Marcus 
Driggers for mobile home 
underpenning, house wir-
ing, refrigeration 
problmes, air-condition-
ing, plumbing and home 
repair. Ph. 725-7227. 

FOR SALE: 1 FiRie Colt 
by Pacific Bert AA, out of 
a AA producing Grand-
daughter of double bid. 1 
Fink Colt by Pacific Bert 
AA out of a Daughter of 
Moncango AAA. 629-
1528. t100 

TEXAS PRESS 
MEMBER  1979 ASSOCIAtION 

Factory Authorized 
Service 

on 
Zenith and Milieu TV , 
Gorman TV Service 

Call 
Higginbothams 

643-2271 

Desks, chairs, files, safes, 
tables, cash and carry. 
Save 20- 50 per cent. 
Large selection. 9- 5:30 
weekdays. Value City, 
1030 Butternut, Abilene. 
t- 

o  



For God so loved the 
world, that he gave his only 
begotten 	Son, 	that 
whosoever believeth in him 
should not perish, but have 
everlasting life. ( John 3:16) 

Let your spirits soar as you 
kneel in humble adoration to 
the One who came to Earth 
to give 	Divine Power, 
Divine Love, Divine Strength 
to all who accept Him, open 

Scripture Thought 

Of The Day 
Hear the word of Jehovah, ye children of 

Israel; for Jehovah hath a controversy 
with the inhabitants of the land, because 
there 	is no truth, nor goodness, nor 
knowledge of God in the land. There is 
nought but swearing and breaking faith, 
and killing, and stealing and committing 
adultery; they break out, and blood 
toucheth blood. ( Hosea 4:1,2) 

In these times, 
a wife who 

doesn't work 
is a luxury! 

Whatever happens 
well make it 

together. 

$ 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
$ 1,000 
Money 
Market 
$10,000 

51/4% 5.39% 
53/4% 5.92% 
61/2% 6.72% 
634% 6.98% 
71/2% 7.79% 
734% 8.06% 
8% 8.33%- 

Variable 
Call us collect for 
the weekly rate. 

This year's a real puzzler. Anything could happen. But no matter 
what, you can count on us to hang in there with you. Just like we 
have for 51 years. 

And when you save with us you'll earn the highest rates allowed 
by law. 

You Deposit 	 Compounded 	Your 
This Lump Sum 	 Daily At 	 Actual 
(Minimum) 	 This Rate 	 Yield Is 

For 
This 
Long 

Osamatic 
Prestige 
Account 

6 mos. 
1 yr. 
30 mos. 
4 yrs. 
6 yrs. 
8 yrs. 
6 mos. 

For quotes on deposits over $100,000, just give us a call. 
Early withdrawal on savings certificates is subject to reduction to passbook rate 
plus 90 days interest penalty. 

RANGER 
SAVINGS 

EASTLAND 
SAVINGS 

Both divisions of Olney Savings 

To us, people are worth a lot more than money. 

Thursday, February 22, 1979 

Chilton--Williams 
Engagement Announced 

May FHA Has Busy Week 

Debra Lee Chilton 

j 

Signature 	  

Date 	  

Residential Homestead Exemption Affidavit 

For The Year 1979 

Applications are available in the Rising Star ISD Tax Office or 

Sign and mail this application to Rowena Chambers, Tax 

Assessor-Collector, P 0 Box 485, Rising Star, Texas. 

Mr. and Mrs. Prentis 
Sansom of Rising Star, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Leland Chilton 
of Gisela, Arizona, have 
announced the engagement 
of their daughter, Debra Lee 
Chilton to Royce Williams of 
Rising Star, son of Barbara 
Williams and the late Royce 
Lee Williams Sr. of 
Mona ha ns. 

The bride-elect graduated 
from Haskell High School 

PERSONALS: 
Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Davis 

and Exia Cawley of Port 
Neches, and Villa Gregg of 
Abilene, have been house 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Cawley. They were here to 
attend the funeral of their 
uncle, Mr. Tom Amis, 
formerly of Eastland. He was 
living at Richardson at the 
time of his death. 

Colleen and Jody Hook from 
Poolville, Ronnie, Pat and 
Chad Barr of Brownwood 
spent the weekend with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Cole 
White.  

presenteo 11) we ning nuu 
Queen by the FHA girls. The 
girls helped serve and clean 
up following the noonmeal. 
Candy filled goodie bags and 
cards were delivered to 
residents of the Rising Star 
Nursing Center. The May 
FHA girls enjoy helping 
make others day a little 
brighter. 

The May FHA sponsor to 
Mrs. Terry Geye. 

Tina Webber is working on 
a display for the Area FHA 
meeting to be held in Abilene 
in March. She will be using 
pictures and news clippings 
to illustrate the projects and 
programs May has par-
ticpated in this year. 

0 Listen to the voice of the 0 
Majesty on High and as a 0 
glad, loving, joy-springing 0 
child accepts the Voice of her 0 
father calling her to oartilirp 
in the delights and mysteries 
of a journey to far places, so 0 
Trust and Believe in your 0 
heart joyfully, as you an-
ticipate 

 
the wonders to which 0 

your Heavenly Father is 0 
calling you. Seeing them in 0 
prayer, 	arise 	in His 0 
Strength, filled with the t 
desire and determination to IA  
reach that Heavenly Glory I 

BUSINESS 

OPPORTUNITY: 

TEXAS SERVICED STATION 

for Lease. 

201 West College, 

Risng Star, Texas. 

Station available with or 

without equipment. 

The May High School FHA 
girls are very active this 
week celebrating Valentine's 
Day. 

Monday the Sophomore 
FHA for girls gave 
decorated 	heart-shaped 
cakes to all the teachers and 
auxiliary personel at the 
school. The Sophomore girls 
who were in charge of this 
were: Belinda Simpson, 
Sherry Wade, Janette 
Holmes, Michelle Chambers, 
Kathryn Roberts, Jackie 
Knight and Tina Webber. It 
was a chore to make all these 
cakes. The girls had been 

learning 	about 	cake 
decorating and used this 
opportunity to put into 
practice 	their 	newly 
developed skills. 

Mrs. Jacki Tischler gave 
the class a very interesting 
demonstration on cake 
decoration. 

The FHA girls wanted to 
share their time with others, 
so they helped the Senior 
Citizens have a nice day at 
the Center by decorating the 
Center. They used red and 
white gingham print table 
cloths with red flowers as the 
centerpiece. A box of 
Valentine candy was 

and i is currently attending 
Tarleton College, where she 
is majoring in elementary 
education. 

Her fiance attended 
Monahans High School and is 
employed by Dynamic In-
dustries: 

The couple plan a March 
10th wedding at the Rising 
Star Church of Christ. 

They will make their home 
in Rising Star. 

Liahts From 
1 The Christian World 

By Josephine Cleveland 

Old Man Winter's Fancy Work 
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their hearts to Him, and seek $ 
to live His Life. 

' 4#e 	For God, in Divine Love t 
gave his Son to you--There is 5 
no limits to His giving-- 5 

I There may be limits to your 0 
accepting. 

It 

• 

• 

prepared for you. 	 wis‘ 	 01 I 	 swiio L'w I kIkw • 061.1 b 	og 

Contact: Tony Long 

Texaco 

Rising Star 

Ph. 817-643-2341 

	 Independent School District 

Owner 
	

Property Description 

Address 

Notice is hereby given that persons who own their residential 

homestead may apply for the Homestead Exemption in the amount 

of $5,000 Of Market Value, by mailing this affidavit to the office of 

the Tax Assessor-Collector between the dates of January 1, 1979 

and April 30, 1979. To qualify, applicants must ascribe to the 
following: 

	 , do solemly swear and 

affirm that I was the owner of the above described 

property and it was my residential homestead on 

January 1, 1979. Further, that I have not claimed a 

residence homestead on any other property for this 

year. Finally, that I understand that any person who 

makes a false affidavit shall be subject to the perjury 

laws of the State of Texas. 



°Obituaries 

45 ACRES 
with small but nice 3 bedroom, 1,100 sq. ft, home. Has 
new carpet, 2 car enclosed garage. Wooded and pasture 
land in Eastland county, good fences and barns, 2 stock 
tanks, deer and turkey. Only 2% miles from Lake Leoa 
$43,900 

535 N. Kent, Gorman, 4 bedroom, 3 bath brick. Two. 
fireplaces, beamed ceiling in den. New Carpet 
throughout. Lots of storage, large utility area, dish-
washer. Water well, covered patio. $39,500. 

Excellent building site-75 foot by 210 feet on Pershing 
street-Gorman $1,800. 

2 bedroom rock house on S. Fisher Street in Gorman. 
Separate dining room, pecan trees, large lot $15,000. 

Business opportunity-21/2  acres on Interstate 20. 
Restaurant, six courts, station with living quarters. 

2 bedroom mobile home on 110 x 200 lot. Partially 
furnished. $6,500. 

314 S. Third, Gorman. 3 Bedroom, 11/2  baths, brick, 1 
car garage 1100 square feet, total electric, central 
heating and air, carpet. Close to schools. $26,000. 

318 N. Kent St. Gorman-3 bedroom large older home. 
Newly remodeled bathroom. Separate dining room, 
paneled throughout. Good location on corner lot, large 
oak trees, metal storage building $11,000. 

Real Cute!-1 bedroom house in Gorman. Paneled pink 
siding exterior. Ideal for young couple $7,000. 

210 E. Lexington, Gorman-3 bedroom, 12 baths, brick, 2 
car garage, central heating and air, carpet 4 years old. 
$25,000. 

WE NEED LISTINGS 
Jerry Mehaffey, Broker 

CEN-TEX 
REAL ESTATE 

Call anytime 
Johnny Watson 
817-734-2777 

Jerry Mehaffey 
`Broker 

P.O. Box 727 
Gorman Texas 

mmimaras 

Cen-Tex Real Estate 
LYLIA MEHAFFEY 	JOHNNIE WATSON 
Carbon 639-2387 	 Gorman 734-2777. 

192 ACRE RANCH 
with 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 2,000 sq. ft. home. All improved 
pasture with good fences and cross fences. 500 to 600 
pecan trees, bottom land on bath sides of 1/2  mile river, 
also 6 tanks. Great hunting for dove, quail, deer and 
turkey. 
$146,000 

51 ACRES 
with beautiful 2 yr. old brick 3,000 sq. ft home, very 
spacious with 3 bedrooms, 2 baths. Central heating and 
AC with fireplace in huge den and family room, ad-
joining separate game room, All improved pasture with 
good metal corrals. 3 stock ponds, 3 water wells. $116,000 

Horace Callaway 
Mr. Callaway died at 6:10 

a.m. Wednesday in E.L. 
Graham Memorial Hospital 
after a brief illness, 
He was born May 1, 1905, 

in Cisco. He had moved here 
from Rising Star five years 
ago. He was a retired farmer 
and carpenter. He married 
Fay Nelms on December 23, 
1922, in Moran. He was a 
member of Interstate 20 
Church of Christ. 
Survivors include his wife; 

three sons, Wayne of Rising 
Star, Don of Brownwood and 
Jack of Jeffersonville, Ind.; a 
daughter, Barbara Nichols of 
Abilene; four brothers. 
Henry of Cross Plains, H.A. 
of Lake Brownwood, Howard 
of San Angelo and H.H. 
(Shorty) of Cisco; four 
sisters, Florence Oakley of 
Salem, Ore., Lorene Grace of 
Bass Lake, Calif., Naomi 
Dennis of Phoenix, Ariz., 
and Opal Mann of Collins. 
Miss.; 15 grandchildren and 
14 great-grandchildren. 
Funeral services for Horace 

Leon Callaway, 73, of Cisco, 
were at 2:30 p.m. Friday in 
Holly-Rhyne Funeral Home 
Chapel. Gary Adams, 
officiated, assisted by J.B. 
Hudson. both Church of 
Christ ministers. Burial was 
in Oakwood Cemetery. 

Ressie Chambers 

Services for Ressie May 
Chambers, 70, were held at 
10 a.m. Saturday at the First 
Baptist Church with the Rev. 
Dick Williams, pastor, of- 
ficiating assisted by Audie 
Moore, minister of the Cross 
Plains Church of Christ. 

Burial was at Rising Star 
Cemetery under the 
direction of Higginbotham 
Funeral Home_ 

Mrs. Chambers died at 10 
a.m. Thursday at the West 
Texas Medical Center in 
Abilene after a short illness. 

She was born April 26, 1908 
in Portales, N. M. where she 
married Fletcher Chambers 
Feb. 26, 1927. He preceded 
her in death May 29, 1967. A 
Rising Star resident 40 
years, she was a homemaker 
and a member of the First 

• Baptist Church. 
Survivors include two 

sons, Dewie Chambers and 
Woody Chambers, both of 
Rising Star; four daughters, 
Dortha Neumann of 
Midland, Roberta Conlee of 
Cross Plains, Tressie Basse 
of Sherry, Okla., and Donnie 
Rodgers of Gorman; two 
brothers, 	Ottis Anderson 
and Ezra Anderson, both of 
Fort Worth; seven sisters, 
Altra Rhodes and Sally 
Pierce, both of Fort Worth, 
Ruby Parks of Denver, 
Colo., ivy Townsend of 
Clovis, N.M., Essie Swopes 
of Portales, N. M., Myrtle 
Pepper of Frenso, Calif., and 
Irene Shifflett of De Leon; 21 
grandchildren and eight 
great-grandchildren. 

A son, Delwin Chambers, 
also preceded her in death in 
1966. 

Shug Culwell 
Services for Shug Joel 

Culwell. 69, were held at 10 
a.m. Thursday at Higginbo-
tham Funeral Home with the 
Rev. Dick Williams. pastor of 
the First Baptist Church 
officiating. Burial was at 
Colorado City. 
Mr. Culwell died at 5:30 

p.m. Tuesday at his 
residence after an apparent 
heart attack. 
He was born Jan. 28. 1909 

in Okra. He was a retired 
mechanic. He moved to 
Rising Star from Colorado 
City five years ago. 
Survivors include two 

brothers. Tommy Culwell of 
Cross Plains and Willard 
Culwell of Georgetown; and 
several nieces and nephews. 
He was preceeded in death 

by three brothers and a 
sister. 

Gardening is becoming 
more popular for many 
reasons -- it's fun, economi-
cal and home grown veget-
ables taste so goodl 4-H 
members know the value of 
growing your own food and 
many have already had 
gardens in the past. 
There's always more to 

learn about gardening and 
that's what the 4-H Garden-
ing project is all about. There 
will be a 4-H Gardening 
Project Training Thursday, 
February 22nd at 4:30 p.m. 
in the Texas Electric Reddy 
Room in Eastland. This train-
ing is for all 4-H members; 
parents, and leaders who are 
interested in the Gardenina 
project. Persons from other 
organizations or who just 
want to know more about 
gardeninG are alcn welromp 

to attend. Educational pro-
grams conducted by the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service serve people of all 
ages, regardless socio 
economic level, race, color, 
sex, religion, or national 
origin. 

LADIES 

The ladies Bible Class of the 
church of Christ met 
February 7, 1979 with the 
theme of "Am I My 
Brother's Keeper?" After a 
song led by Jackie Le Bleu 
and a prayer by Eleonor 
Nunnally, Cindy Wiggins led 
the discussion centered 
around Philippians 2:3-5 
which clearly shows we are 
our brother's keepers. 
Jeolously and envy are two 
things that we learned hinder 
us from truly caring for our 
brothers. Three ways to over-
come these hinderances were 
discussed: (1) look for the 
good that can be found in 
every person, (2) pray for 
and with the person, and (3) 
find ways to demonstrate 
your Christian love is service 
to others. 
Others present were Mable 

Lee, Opal Hill, Lolene Cla-
born, Ruth Murphy, La 
La Verne Carol!, and Velma 

LeBieu  All ladies are invited to 
come enjoy our fellowship 
and study. We meet each 
Wednesday morning at 9:30 
in the fellowship room at the 
church's building located at 
204 West College Street. 

We were shocked to learn of 
Kelly Kent's sudden death. 
Our hearts go out to sister 
Tennie Jones in the loss of 
her grandson. 

Cindreypoa  Wiggins,
er  
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March 6th Deadline For SBA Applications 
WASHINGTON, D.C.--

Congressman Charles W. 
Stenholm advises of the 
March 6. 1979. deadline for 
submitting applications for 
the Physical Disaster Loan 
Program through the Small 
Business Administration. 
This program is available to 
farmers and ranchers who 
suffered financial hardship 
due to drought losses on 1978 

crops. 
The disaster loans may be 

used to pay outstanding obli-
gations and operating 
expenses and for production 
costs in the new crop year. 
However. they may not be 
used to refinance a Farmers 
Home Administration or 
other USDA loan. 
Interest rate on SBA physi-

cal disaster loans are 3 

percent on the first 5250,000 
and 6.58 percent on remain-
ing amounts. Further infor-
mation may be obtained from 
the Abilene SBA office 
located in the U.S. Post 
Office Building, 300 Pine 
Street, suite 2211, telephone 
915-677-8537, or at the 
Lubbock SBA office, 720 
Texas Avenue, telephone 
806-762.7459. 

Cisco Junior College Stage Band Festival 
Cisco Junior College will 

host a Stage Band Festival 
Friday, Feb. 23, to 15 area 
bands, according to Tim 
Jones, CJC band director, 
and director for the FestivaL 
It will be held in the Harrell 
Fine Arts Auditorium. 

Trophies in each class and 
one outstanding band trophy 
will be awarded. The bands 
will be scheduled to play 
every 30 minutes, beginning 
at 8:00 	and ending at 
4:30 p.m. The public is in-
vited to the CJC campus, to 
hear the various bands play. 

Judges tor me event will 
be Phil 	Adman, from 
Castleberry High School, 
Fort Worth, Dave Penock, 
Abilene Christian Univeristy 
and Jimmy Mauldin, 
Stephenville. Class B, A, and 
AA bands will be par-
ticipating in the Festival. 

Thursday, February 22, 1979 

Gardening Is Becoming More Popular men In 
Service distributed at this meeting. 

If you are interested in the 
4-H Gardening Project, but 
cannot attend this training 
you can receive further infor-
mation by calling 629-2222 or 
629-1093. 

Kenneth Waites and Trudy 	Project materials will also be 
Bird, County Extension 
Agents, will be conducting 
the gardening training. Some 
of the topics to be covered 
include: Planning a garden, 
preparing the soil, planting 
and harvesting. 4-H Garden 

To The Citizens Of Rising Star 
A City can generate• 

additional money by two 
methods: first method is 
Taxation--which we do not 
need or want and second is 
voting Bonds. There are two 
types of Bonds. The first type 
is General Obligation Bonds 
which have a claim on the 
Tax base of our city. We do 
not want this type -- VOTE 
NO. The second type is 
Revenue Bond which cannot 
have a claim on the tax base 
of our city--this type we 
want--VOTE YES. The 
Attorney General of Texas 
can verify this, if in doubt, 
contact him in Austin, Texas. 

Keep this and read until you 
understand what it is telling 
you. Vote YES in the 
Election. 

Troy I. Willett 
501 W. Pioneer 

Rising Star, Texas 76471 

Maj. Darwin T. Crockett, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. 0. T. 
Crockett, Cross Plains, Tex. 
is participating in the first 
return of Forces to Germany 
( REFORGER) exercise to 
be held in winter. 

REFORGER 79, a 
strategic mobility exercise, 
demonstrates the U. S. 
capability to move by air and 
sea to reinforce NATO 
rapidly in a crisis situation. 

The Reforger units join U. 
S. units stationed in Ger-
many and allied elements for 
the exercise in an area 
between Northern Baden-
Wuerttemberg and Eastern 
Bavaria. 

Army National Guard and 
Army Reserve units also are 
included in Reforger, one of 
NATO's largest annual 
exercises. 

The soldier is a member of 
the 3rd Armored Division in 
Germany. 

His wife, Mary is with him 
in Germany. 

As a registered voting citi-
zen of this community, I see 
the need and necessity for 
improvement. The streets, 
water and sewer systems 
needed improving years back 
in the past, when the cost 
would have been much less. 
We as citizens of this city 

know by experience, the past 
or present, that our standard 
of living is set by the amount 
of income we receive. If our 
needs or problems in life 
create a demand higher than 
our income, we must ask for 
and receive finanacial help 
from a lending agency. Take 
this condition and multiply 
by the number of citizens and 
you have the condition of 
what call the City. We must 
all unite, act as a unit, a city, 
to overcome our problems. 
United we survive and grow; 
divided we fail and our 
number of problems increase 
with time. 	 • A blue-ribbon committee 

of 20 area residents has been 
named to sponsor former 

aitTexas Governor John B. Articles Of The P 

WHAT'S COOKIN' IN 
EASTLAND COUNTY 
By Gay Nell O'Brien 

Several people have 
requested the sourdough 
bread or rolls recipe that was 
referred to in the Tidbits 
column a few issues back so 
we are sharing it with you. I 
have only made rolls from 
the recipe so far. 
The recipe will make three 

large cookie sheets full. 
Keep hands greased well 
when shaping to keep from 
sticking. Store in baggies 
when cool. 
We prefer to butter all of 

them while still warm. You 
can wrap in foil and warm in 
conventional oven or heat 
one at a time in microwave 
for 15 seconds. They are 
delicious served with honey 
and have the best crust ever! 

SOURDOUGH ROLLS 
OR BREAD 

In mixing bowl let one cup 
of sour dough set at room 
temperature for one hour. 
Dissolve two packages yeast 
in one cup of warm water. 
Let stand 10 minutes. 
To sourdough add 1 egg, 1/12 

cup sugar, 11/2  tsp. salt, 1 
cup warm water. Beat well. 
Add yeast mixture. Add 5-6 
cups flour. Do not make too 
stiff for lighter rolls. Can be 
mixed mostly with mixer but 
last two cups may have to be 
stirred by hand. 
Put in greased bowl and let 

rise, punch down and let rise 
again. 
Make into rolls, loaves, 

etc.. greasing pans well. Let 
rise. 
Bake at 375 degrees for 

10-15 minutes for rolls, until 
well browned, and 25-35 
minutes for loaves. 

SOURDOUGH STARTER 
2 cups flour 
1 pkg. dry yeast 
2 cups warm water 
1 Tbsp. sugar 
Mix thoroughly and let 

stand about 48 hours until 
bubbly. 
Use all of starter for cooking 

except for one cup which is 
used to keep you supplied 
with starter. To the one cup 
reserved and VA cups flour 
and two cups warm water 
and allow to stand about 12 
hours in warm place. 
Again use all starter except 

one cup and repeat. If not 
used every 12 hours it can be 
kept in refrigerator up to 
three weeks. 
Readers are invited to share 

their special recipes: breads, 
sourdough or otherwise. 
We already have a special 

request for a chicken 
spaghetti recipe. 
Send in care of this news-

paper and column. 

Connally's campaign visit to 
Abilene o on February 23, to 
begin his guest for the 
Republican nomination for 
President. 

The Abilene Host Com-
mittee includes Don Maples 
as chairman, with Walter 
Johnson and Syd Niblo as 
vice-chairman. 

The Abilene committee, as 
well as all others across the 
state, is typical of the borad 
based support Connally is 
receiving since announcing 
his presidential plans on 
January 24. The host com-
mittees on all 24 Texas stops 
include more than 1500 
prominent Republicans, 
Democrats and Indpendents. 

The tour will leave Lub-
bock for Abilene on Ft iday, 
February 23. Connally and 
wife Nellie will be guests at a 
continental breakfast to be 
held at the Abilene Civic 
Center at 8 a.m., before 
leaving for Brownwood and 
the tour's third day of ac-
tivity. 

There will be no admission 
charge to the breakfast and 
the event is open to the 
public. For more in-
formation call 698-8234. 

The tour will cover all 
parts of the state and will 
close with a birthday 
reception for Governor 
Connally in Houston on 
February 27. 

The Abilene host com-
mittee is made up of! 

Mr. Don Maples 
Chairman 

Mr. Walter Johnson 
Vice-Chairman 
Mr. Syd Niblo 

Vice Chairman 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Bailey, 

Mr. and Mrs. John H. 
Chalmers, Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Crawford, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Gordon, Mr. and 
Mrs. Oliver Howard, Mrs. 
Walter Johnson, Mrs. Don 
Maples, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Matthews, Mr. and Mrs. 
Riley Maxwell, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack McGlothlin, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ken Murphy, Mrs. Syd 
Niblo, Dr. and Mrs. Jack D. 
Ramsey, Dr. and Mrs. 
Wayne V. Ramsey, Jr., Mr. 
and Mrs. Scott Taliaferro, 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Taylor, 
Mr. and Mrs. H. P. Wells, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Wright, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Wright. 

SPEC 11:11L11 

The Rising Star X-Ray 
carried this article in the 
June 24, 1921 issue. 

James Company Gets 
Contract For Water 

And Sewer 
Rising Star to 

Have Adequate 
Systems 

the Janes Contracting Co. of 
Dallas were awarded the 
contract to build both the 
water and sewerage system 
in Rising Star and actual 
work if to start in a few days. 
Mayor Childress and the 
alderman opened bids 
Tuesday night of this week. 
They had for consideration 
bids from a number of 
construction companies, 
most of who had represen-
tatives here. 

The bonds which were 
recently voted are $35,000.00 
for the water system and 
$30,000.00 for the sewerage 
systems. At the same time 
bonds for $35,000.00 were 
voted for street paving, 
contract for which will be let 
before the completion of the 
pipe laying of the other two 
jobs. 

Paving cannot be started 
anyway while the other work 
is going on. The Janes 
Contracting Co. is equipped 
both financially and 
otherwise to handle the work 
in a satisfactory manner. We 
learn they propose to buy the 
bonds at par, so the question 
of finance is settled. Only a 
short time is needed to finish 
the legal proceedings of the 
bond issue and by that time 
material will be on the 
ground to start the work. 
Only forty clays is needed for 
pipe laying after the work 
starts, but it may take a little 
longer to get the standpipe 
here and erected. 

Rising Star in her rapid 
growth is building per-
manently and also getting all 
the modern conveniences. 
We have already a modern 
light and power plant and an 
ice plant. A franchise has 
been granted for a gas 
system in the town and the 
pipe is to be laid before the 
street paving begins. When 
the water and sewage 
systems are completed and 
the streets paved we will 
then have a town of modern 
conveniences. 

Sgt. Charles K. Jones, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Donald R. 
Jones, Route 1, May, Texas, 
recently particpated in Level 
II gunnery training with the 
3rd Armored Division in 
Germany. 

Level H tank gunnery 
training, conducted at the 
Grafenwohr and Hohenfels 
Training Areas, is one of the 
two times a year when tank 
battalions have to fire live 
ammunition. Individual tank 
crews develop their 
necessary team work to take 
on stationary and moving 
targets. 

The training is designed to 
increase the combat ability 
of the tank, mechanized 
infantry, artillery and attack 
helicopter units to destroy 
enemy tanks and other 
hostile combat formations in 
battle. 

Jones is a tank com-
mander with the division in 
Budingen, Germany. 

His wife, Glenda, is with 
him i in Germany. 

Meat should be frozen at 
100F. or less, and as quickly 
as possible. 

March I, 1979. is the dead-
line for some farmers to file 
their 1978 federal income tax 
return and pay any tax due, 
the Internal Revenue Service 
said. 

Persons who earned at least 
two-thirds of their 1978 gross 
income from farmind and did 
not file a declaration of 
estimated federal individual 
income tax by January 15, 
1979, or pay any amount of 
estimated federal individual 
income tax by January 15, 
1979. or pay any amount of 
estimated tax by this date. 
must file their return and pay 
all tax due by March 1, 1979, 
to avoid a penalty. 
IRS Publication 225, 

"Farmer's Tax Guide." and 
505. "Tax Withholding and 
Declaration of Estimated 
Tax." provide additional in-
formation and are available 
free from local IRS offices. HIGGINBOTHAM'S 

Main St. Rising Star City Receives $1392.37 In Sales Tax 

LADIES 

SLIPS 

MEN'S LONG 
SLEEVE DRESS 
AND SPORTS 

SHIRTS 

The rebate check for San 
Antonio will total $1.3 million 
or an increase of 35 percent 
over the 1978 allocation for 
February. 

Over 909 Texas cities will 
receive rebates as their 
share of the city sales tax. 

The sales tax is collected 
by merchants and other 
sales tax permit holders 
along with the state sales tax 
and is rebated monthly to 
cities in which it is collected 
by the Comptroller's Office. 

The City of Rising Star will 
receive $1,392.37 for the 
period ending 2-01-79. 

$32.2 million, an increase of 
$11.5 million. 

Houston will receive $5.4 
million for this reporting 
period, compared to a 
payment $2.8 million during 
February of 1978, or an in-
crease o of about 30 percent. 

For Worth's check for 
February will be $954,490 
compared to $542,741 
received by the city during 
February last year. 

Dallas will get a check for 
$2.4 million, which is 25 
percent more than the 
amount paid during the 
same period in 1978. 

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock Thursday said 
rebates to Texas cities of the 
local option one percent 
sales tax are up a whopping 
36 percent this month over 
the same period last year. 

Bullock said Texas cities 
will receive a rebate of some 
$25.5 million this month, 
compared to a net payment 
of about $13.7 for February 
last y year. 

The 1979 year-to-date 
payments for city sales tax 
rebates have climbed to $43.7 
million, compared to a two-
month figure last year of 
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A Neighborhood Professional" 
can be your best friend. 

Training and experience. Knowledge 
of the local market. Under- 
standing real estate rules and 
regulations. Those are just three 
reasons why we can be your 
best friend when you're selling a 
house. There are 18 more in our 
21 Reasons Why CENTURY 21 
Should Sell Your House For You 
brochure. Let us show you how we 

can be your new best friend. 
Call or drop by today for your 

complimentary copy. 

We're the Neighborhood Professionals' 
Each office is independently owned and operated. 

• • 

CENTURY 21. 21 Reasons brochure at participating offices 

1978 CENTURY 21 REAL ESTATE CORPORATION • PRINTED IN U.S.A. • EQUAL HOUSING OPPORTUNITY CI 
ICE NSF 0 TRADE WAX DE CENTURY 2' REAL ESTATE CORPORAION 

CISCO 

FOWLER REALTORS 
RANGER EASTLAND 

REDUCED TO SELL very spacious 3 bedroom central heated 
home with one full and 2-half baths, formal dining room, den, 
fireplace in living room, large kitchen with some built-ins, large 
glass enclosed patio, attached double carport and also a small 
liveable unit in back. Why not add your redecorating touch to 
this roomy older home? 
FRESH ON MARKET are you looking for a 3 bedroom, 13/4  bath 
home, with a cozy fireplace to beat the cost of heating? This 
home is on two lots, surrounded by pecan trees, with nice garden 
spot and a large double garage. Please call us for more in-
formation. 
FRESH ON MARKET 3 bedroom 11/2  bath brick home, close to 
schools. Ideal location with central air and heat. Call today 
about the financing available. 
5 LOTS-EXCELLENT LOCATION-City water, sewer available, 
gas. City streets on both sides of property. Ideal building site. 
Call for details. 
NEW LISTING recently remodeled, 3 bedroom, living room and 
den, new carpet, priced to sell in mid teens, call for details. 
VERY COZY 3 bedroom home, small buy very neat. Nice 
draperies throughout. Large metal double garage with work 
area. House behind could be remodeled for rental or sold to be 
moved. This home is central heating, paneled, carpeted and 
ready for you. 
LARGE 3 BEDROOM HOME on 3 lots-Buy equity and assume 
loan of only $11,400. A good solid home priced for quick sale. 
RECENTLY REMODELED Good location on 13th Street 2 nice 
2 bedroom with study. Good financing low down payment-
immediate occupancy. Call for details. 
EQUITY BUY Real nice 3 bedroom home, 2 car carport with 
storage room Shady corner lot with fenced back yard. Excellent 
condition. Buy equity and assume loan. Immediate position. 
MORAN-2 or 3 bedroom, 2 bath home, 2 car garage with work 
shop. This large house has 11/2  lots-Come see us about the easy 
financing available. 

NOW ON MARKET-2 bedroom home on corner lot, 1 car garage 
with s storage, close to school, paved street $350. down $16,750. 
Call for more details. 
COMPLETELY REMODELED-4 bedroom, 2 bath, 2 car 
garage, on 3 lots, excellent location, close to schools, really a 
honey for $20,950. with $450 down, call for more details. 
PRETTY AND COMFORTABLE describes this 3 bedroom, 2 
bath white brick home on corner lot, located in one of Ranger's 
finest neighborhood. Some of the extras includes vaulted ceiling, 
fireplace, all the built-ms plus ash cabinets in the room kitchen. 
Have to see to appreciate-call for appointment today. 
JUST REMODELED-Nice 3 bedroom home redone inside and 
out. Vacant and ready for you. See today $20,950. Small down 
FHA-financing available. 
SEE TO APPRECIATE Nice 3 bedroom home on corner lot-
beautiful panelin small down payment on FHA Loan. 
PRICED TO SELL 3 bedroom home in good location, remodeled 
a year ago. Good financing, call for details today-won't last long. 
BARGAIN-REDUCED-Good buy on this 2 bedroom frame 
home-reduced to $5,000. for quick sale. 

REAL NICE 2 bedroom frame home in nice neighborhood 
priced to sell. Call for details. 
NEW LISTING Older home in very good condition, this 3 
bedroom 2 bath central air and heat, with new carpet in living 
room and bedrooms. Nice and quite neighborhood-call for ap-
pointment to see won't last long. 
ON MAIN STREET for commercial or residential, large kitchen 
area 3 other rooms and bath. Corner lot for amply parking. 
Priced to sell in mid-teens, call for details. 
OWNER SAYS SELL!!! In Eastland's finest neighborhood 
come see this 3 bedroom, 2 car garage, wood burning fireplace, 
central air and heat, loaded with extras. Excellent financing 
available trade-ins considered-call for more information. 
MOBILE HOME Very nice 2 bedroom, central air and heat, 
utility room. Buy equity and assume low monthly payments of 
$110.37 call for details. 
FRESH ON MARKET VERY NEAT 3 bedroom home in nice 
neighborhood chain link fence, 2 guard lights, call for details 
and appointment to see. 
LARGE CORNER LOT over 1/2  acre in desirable established 
neighborhood all utilities in. Convinient to store and town. Good 
building site or divide $10,000 financing available. 

COMMERCIAL ACREAGE FRESH ON MARKET Apartment rental in good location in 
Eastland, close to downtown-owner has priced to sell-call for 
appointment to see and let us tell you the details about the 
financing available. 
Dreams really do come true and you can make it happen with 
this combination grocery store, station, and bait house right 
next door to your comfortable 3 bedroom home on one acre at 
Lake Leon, convenient to fishing, boating and ski ing area. Call 
soon. 

396 Acres Northwest of Ranger, highway frontage. Coastal and 
love grass with three stock tanks makes this a real nice place. 
Priced to sell, call for details. 

ACREAGE ACREAGE 
COMMERCIAL 

SOUTH OF CISCO-80 acres improved $500 per acre. 

COMMERCIAL COMMERCIAL BUILDING Good investment on Main Street in 
Ranger-leased to four going business-Call for more information. 
IDEAL ESTABLISHED BUSINESS for retired couple in 
Ranger. Miniture Golf Course with all equipment and con-
cession station. Priced for quick sale $20,000.00. INVESTMENT PROPERTY Combination residental and 

business in good location. Too many extras to list. Priced has 
been reduced and owner has included other extras-perfect 
opportunity call for information. 
COMMERCIAL BUILDING with inventory for fast foods. 
Excellent opportunity for interested-party. Owner financing 
available, Call for details. 

LOVELY COUNTRY HOME 5 miles Northwest of town. Three 
bedroom 2 bath all built-ins, living-room, dining room, den with 
wooden fireplace. Very attractive home, call for appointment to 
see. 
COMANCHE COUNTY 292 acres-72 acres peanut allotment 110 
coastal 110 cultivation with a real nice 3 bedroom 2 bath home, 
irrigation wells, 2 stock tanks plus 1 irrigation tank call for 
details. 
LAKE LEON ROAD 41/2  acres good building site $4,500. 
161 ACRES 14 miles Northwest of Ranger 40 acres coastal 
bermuda 20 love grass 101 range land-improved. Fenced and 
crossed fenced, two tanks and corrals. 
COMMANCHE COUNTY 150 acres-Pecan and peach trees-wells. 
that pump 20 gallons water per minute. 15 acres of timber. Call 
for complete details. 
73 Acres with 101/2  Acres of peanut allotment located 2 miles 
Eastland of Gorman. Approximately 35 to 40 acres in coastal, 
remainer in native burmuda grass, good fences. Call for details. 

FOR MORE INFORMATION ON 

EASTLAND'S LISTINGS CALL: 
Wayne Durham 629-8212 	Carol Senkel 629-1269 

Kenny Cogburn 629-2348 	Barbara Love 647.1914 

Myrna Dabney 629-8105 Hazel Underwood 629-1188 

Peggye Swofford 647.1050 

820 W. Main-Eastland 

WE NAVE OTHER LISTINGS IN RANGER-CALL THE 

NUMBER BELOW FOR MORE INFORMATION: 

Bill Griffith 647-1635 

107 A Main-Ranger 

647-1302 

WE HAVE OTHER CISCO LISTINGS CALL THE NUMBER 

BELOW FOR MORE INFORMATION: 

Ann Williams 442.1933 

Teens McMurry 442.2459 

Dana Goosen 442-3958 

707 Ave. D-Cisco Office 

442-3568 

EQUAL HOUSING 
OPPORTUNITIES 

1t 
REAL TOR'  

629-1769 
FHA-VA-CONVENTIONAL FINANCING 

C. ANGY FOWLER, OWNER-BROKER 

OPEN DAILY MONDAY THRU SATURDAY 8 TO 6 

21 



THE TAKING OFF OF A SHOE IN BIBLICAL TIMES 
WAS THE SIGN A MAN USED TO SHOW THAT HE WAS 
NOT WILLING TO MAKE A DEAD BROTHER'S WIDOW 
HIS WIFE-THIS WAS A LEVIRATE DUTY WHICH EN-
ABLED THE DEAD MAN'S NAME TO BE KEPT ALIVE IN 
ISRAEL, FOR THE FIRST SON OF THIS UNION WOULD 
BE COUNTED AS THE DEAD MAN'S SON AND WOULD RE-
CEIVE HIS INHERITANCE. g0Az, A NEAR-KINSMAN OF 
THE WIDOW RUTH (RUTH 4,1-14) WISHED TO MARRY 
HER BUT THERE WAS A NEARER KINSMAN TO WHOM 
THE PRIVILEGE BELONGED. HOWEVER,THiS MAN WAS 
UNWILLING AND, IN THE PRESENCE OF TEN ELDERS AS 
WITNESSES, HE TOOK OFF HIS SHOE AND GAVE IT TO 
50Az, SHOWING HE DIDN'T WISH TO "STAND IN THE 
SHOES OF THE DEAD MAN THUS BOAZ WAS FREE 
TO MARRY RUTH AS NEXT OF KIN,WH ICH RESOLVED 
THE MATTER HAPPILY-HOWEVER....  

•r 

WE DO IT EVERY NIGWIT OF OUR LAVES, 
WITI-101)T EVEUNIINKING ABOUT nr-avr, 

r  IN SIBLICALTIME5,, 
COVLD HAVE A 

' YEW SERIOUS 
CONNOTATOON 

...IT DIDN'T ALWAYS WORK OUT AS EASILY AS THAT! THE LAW, AS 
STATED IN DEUT.25:5-10, HELD THAT A BROTHER OR NEAREST OF 
KIN WAS DUTY-BOUND TO TAKE HIS BROTHER'S WIDOW TO WIFE IF 
THE BROTHER DIED CHILDLESS (IF THE WIDOW HAD CHILDREN, THEY 
HAD TO CARE FOR HER IN HER OLD AGE). NOW, IF A MAN REFUSE TO 
TAKE HIS BROTHER'S CHILDLESS WIDOW AS A WIFE, THEN, BEFORE 
THE ASSEMBLAGE OF THE TRIBE SHE WOULD "LOOSE HIS SHOE FROM 
OFF HIS FOOT, AND SPIT IN HIS FACE", BECAUSE THE CULPRIT WOULDN'T 
DO HIS DUTY TO HIS DEAD BROTHER BY GIVING HIM A LIVING SON ! 
HIS NAME WOULD THEN BE KNOWN THROUGHOUT ISRAEL AS`11-IE HOUSE 
OF HIM THAT HATH HIS SHOE LOOSED': SO TO REFUSE THIS DUTY WAS 
A MARK OF SHAME TO THESE ANCIENT PEOPLE-BEFORE A MAN 
DID THAT, HE'D BE BETTER TO- IN THE 3ARGON OF TODAY'S YOUNG 
PEOPLE-"COOL IT WITH THAT SHOE, MAN!" 

NEXT WEEK:\\LET's GO HUNTING.'" 
• ,,;r: 

74.,G 

SAVE THIS FOR YOUR SUNDAY SCHOOL SCRAP-500K 	  

The Following Advertisement is Paid For By These Local Merchants. 

        

         

TWIN DRILLING 

643-7100 

  

SOMERFORDS GROCERY 

643-3161 

   

PRUITT WELDING 
SERVICE 

643-5051 

THE RISING STAR 

  

STAR FLORIST 

  

JONES TIRE STORE 

643-4141 

  

643-2023 

   

643-3364 

4A 
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;" THIS SUNDAY. 

CONNIE'S BEAUTY 
SALON 
643-4673 

CITY OF RISING 
STAR 

643-4261 

KIZER INSURANCE 
CO- 

64,3-4421 

BUTLER MOTER 
COMPANY 

643-3261 

RISING STAR CHAMBER 
OF COMMERCE 

643-2251 

THE BEE AND THE 
HONEY BEE RANCH 

RAGS  643-1601  

Attend The Church Of Your 

WHITE'S 
PIT BARBECUE 

643-2331 

MEDLEY MOTER 
COMPANY 

643-6211 

KOUNTRY KITCHEN 

643-6831 

HIGGINBOTHAMS 

643-2271 

JENKINS INSURANCE 
COMPANY 

643-2251 

PALACE DRUG STORE 

643-3231 

BIBBY'S CREATIONS , 

643-6691 

ATTEND THE CHURCH OF YOUR CHOICE 

J & S GROCERY 

643-2221 

COTTON'S CONOCO 

643-2461 

QUIK STOP GROCERY 

643-1441 

Thursday, February 22, 1979 

WILLIET'S WASHTERIA 
643-7033 



WISDOM'S CORNER 
When three people lose 

their memories at the same 
time-a boy, an elderly man, 
and a cocksure young man 
called Jemone begins to 
suspect more than coin-
cidence. It is suddenly the 
land of nowhere and Jem, 
who seems to remember the 
most, conviences Roger and 
Bowler Hat that their loss of 
memory is part of a plot and 
they must organize and 
resist. Bowler Hat suspects 
Jem of knowing more than 
he reveals, and Roger's 
suspicion that Jem is evil is 
confirmed when the entire 
town suddenly suffers a loss 
of memory, too, with Jem 
exhorting to citizens to 
follow him. Rogers is now 
certain that the spirit of Jem 
is that lust for power which 
has no respect for in-
dividuality of personal in-
tegrity and a must be 
destroyed. 

The Wise Old Owl 

BIG BRASS 
Contest is drawing nearer 

and rehearsals after school 
have begun. To help improve 
our playing, we have been 
recording ourselves playing 
our c contest music. We play 
the tape so we can hear how 
the whole band sounds. This 
way we can here mistakes 
that we weren't aware of 
when we could hear mainly 
our own instrument. 

We are planning to attend 
a practice playing contest at 
Cisco on March 3. The judges 
will tell us how we can im-
prove before the actual 
U.I.L. contest. Kim Harris 

HURRYtHURRY!HURRY! 
We got an extension on the 

annual. We had pictures 
coming in late, so we 
couldn't get the annual in on 
time. We had to have it in by 
Thursday. It has been lots of 
hard work, but we have 
enjoyed it. Pam Ratliff. 

SOIL IMPROVERS III 
The Junior agriculture 

class ( Soil Improvers III) is 
working harder than ever 
because of the new 
rule..."You no work, you no 
pass"! But then everyone is 
usually pretty busy anyway. 
Last weekend, February 17, 
1979, our FFA judging team 
went to Stephenville. Next 
week I'll let you know how 
they came out. In April the 
Judging team is going to 
Lubbock. We can hardly 
wait. I'll surely let you know 
more next week. Bye Bye 
Lesa Thornton 

WE'VE ONLY JUST 
BEGUN 
Hi, Everyone! 

We're back again. The 
Sophomores are really 
working hard. Last week 
some o of the girls got second 
in the 50's day contest, that 
the Student Council spon-
sored. This week we're 
trying to survive algebra and 
history class, because Mr. 
Stuteville is really laying the 
work on us. In literature 
class we have been reading a 
play about Caesar. Well, 
that's about it for this week. 
Until next week, Teresa 
Underwood. 

‘1School 
Lunchroom 

Menu 

RANGER T  DHR IEVAE T- IRNE  Majestic Theatre 
Eastland Ranger 	 647-3802 

Thursday, February 22, 1979 

WILDCAT 
TALES One Showing Only Each Evening At 8 P.M. 

Closed Thurs. 

Fri. L Sat. Only 

One Showing Only Each Evening. Open 7 P.M 
Show Starts At 7:30 P.M. 

Fri.-Sat.-Sun. 
Adult Entertainment 

THE WHOLE COUNTRY IS 
WAITING TO SEE 

JACQUELINE BISSET 
AS YOU'VE NEVER SEEN 

HER BEFORE! 
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"Jacqueline Bisset is more stunning in 'Secrets' 
than in the 'Greek Tycoon' which hardly seems 
possible. Not only is La Bisset ravishing in 
Secrets', she is also nude . . •"- BIB Van Maurer 

Miami News 

On Wednesday of last week 
the Student Council had an 
Animal Variety Show, 
presented by Cowboy Joe. 
The show was real good. He 
had two different kinds of 
monkeys a horse, two dogs, a 
raccoon, and believe it or 
not, a black bear. I think, 
that Cowboy Joe made a big 
success with the elementary 
kids. Your Senior Reporter 
Kathy Reed 

CROSSING THE BRIDGE 
TOGETHER 

Hello. The Freshmen this 
week have been pretty busy. 
We had an animal show 
Wednesday with bears, 
ponies, etc. 

Our classes seem long. 
Biology, we are studying 
echnoderms. We are 
studying safety in Health. 
English I consists of Poetry. 
We are making pillows in 
Homemaking I. 

Our classmates are almost 
all well. There has been a 
number of them sick. See 
you next week. Margaretta 
Lankford. 
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BRADFORD HEATHER 
OILMAN MENZIES 

KEVIN 	KEENAN BARBARA 
McCARTHY WYNN STEELE 

xoskIlibe 

Isaw,et 	pq et s 

SO 1111  

"Jacqueline Bisset — This tantalizing beauty, 
usually mired in bad films, is here given a 
chance to evolve in a complex, intriguing fash-
ion to create a woman very much the product 
of these confused times."- Candice Russell 	Miami Herald 

A NEW WORLD PICTURE Soil Improvers 
Thornton 

III-Lesa 

IV-John 
Closed Sun. Thru Wed. 

THE EDITOR SPEAKS 
Hello once again! It is me, 

your trusty editor speaking 
once again from the 
hallowed halls of R.S.H.S. 

Things are moving swiftly. 
U.I.L. is just around the 
corner. Tryouts for the 
U.I.L. play were held 
Thursday, February 15th. I 
would like to congratulate 
the eleven people who 
earned parts in the play. 
Good going guys and gals! 

Can you believe it? One 
more week left in this 
quarter and zap, only 60 days 
left of school. It seems like 
only yesterday when we 
started the school year, and 
now it is going to be gone. My 
how time does fly when you 
are having fun! 

We will see you next week 
in the "Wildcat Tails"! Oh 
well, you can't win them all. 
Janetta Lawrence 

Soil Improvers 
David Lee 

Starts Thurs. March 1 

a MASTERPIECE 
of ANIMATION... 
a BURST of FUN 
and ADVENTURE 

JACQUELINE BISSET  
ROBERT POWELL • SHIRLEY KNIGHT HCWINS • PER OSC&RSSQN 

TA R KA KINGS '"'°": JOHN HANSON '111; PHILIP SAVILLE 
A LONE STAR PICTURES INTERNATIONAL RELEASE 

COLOR.,  CFI "air!: 

Next Week Fri.-Sat.-Sun. 

09, 
JOEY HERTHERTON 

in TECHNICOLOR' 
Re releasea 
BUENA VISTA DISTRIBUTION CO INC 
©1978 Well Disney PiOduclions THE 

HAPPY 
HOOKER 

GOES TO 
WASHINGTON 

and a NEW anlrnatton featured° 
destined to become a 

DISNEY HOLIDAY CLASSIC 

SOIL IMPROVERS II 
Here we are again. The 

Sophomores are staying 
busy in Ag. this week. 
Saturday we are supposed to 
go to Stephenville for dairy 
and land judging, but we 
haven't practiced much so 
Mr. Owen is not sure 
whether we will or not. 
Meanwhile, we have been 
straightening up the shop 
and trying to get it to looking 
better. But some of the time 
we have been setting around 
the heater telling stories and 
getting in trouble as usual. 
Everyone is about to get 
through with out individual 
projects in woodwork, 
welding, etc. 

So, I guess that is all-see 
ya n next week. Mike Fraley. 

DO YOU KNOW 
WHERE YOU'RE GOING? 
What a week! We have 

finally gotten started in 
tennis, golf, and track. Now 
it is getting cold, so we are 
not getting as much practice 
as we need. But we have 
been busy. In our classes we 
have worked fairly hard this 
week. In Band we are still 
preparing for our contest. 
We are sounding great. We 
have been reading plays in 
English-Literature. In 
History class, we have been 
reading, taking notes and 
work sheets and a test, been 
busy, busy, busy. We're 
typing away in our typing 
class. We're getting farther 
and farther along in our 
book. We have learned all 
about renting houses and 
apartments in Home and 
Family Living class. 
Bookkeeping is the same 
work-work-work. We are 
moving right along. Some of 
us are going to be dropping 
this class at the beginning of 
the next quarter. ( Maybe 
it's best for all of us) Until 
next week. 

Dena Willett 

SHOOTING STARS 
Well, we just finished out 

our basketball schedule for 
this year, and I got my 
calculator out and figured 
out a few statistics. Next 
week we will change the 
name of my article to 
"Running Stars", because I 
will be writing about track 
and field. I figured out 
everyone's total points for 
the '78-79 basketball year. 

Name-J.D. Lee--Points 
Scored 170 

Kirk Rust--312 
Mark Wilson--243 
Mike Holden-108 
Jeff Rust-86 
Alfonso Martinez-51 
Shannon Childers-10 
Thad Chambers-39 
Wade Ratliff-139 
Marc Kizer-21 
Tommy Kitchens-10 
David Switzer-6 
Jon Vaughn-18 
Damon Cooper-4 
But, folks the scores don't 

tell it all, these boys got out 
and tried whether they were 
basketball players or not. 
That is why we think so 
much of them, because they 
trY l• 

Don't forget our practice 
track meet Friday the 23rd 
at R. S. and don't forget next 
week's article will be 
"Running Stari" 

Gwynn Tharp 

SOIL IMPROVERS IV 
Hello all you Ag IV fans. 

Thank goodness it's Friday. 
We have been building a 
small car and there has been 
a lot of welding and painting. 
We f fixed a boat motor for 
the principal and cleaned up 
the shop. We have finished 
painting the hurdles and the 
name plates. 

WOMEN'S SHOES 
Entire Stock Fall And Winter Styles 

NOW 

60% $64. 
OFF 

Reg. 	SAVE NOW 

$48°  
To 

BY GEORGE 
60% 
Cherry Blossom 

Special 
WE AXED 

THESE 

WOMEN'S DRESSES 
JEANS, KNIT TOPS 

WOMEN'S 
SPORTSWEAR 

One Biq Rack Assorted Styles 
Not All Sizes 

BIG 
SAVINGS 

NOW 
$350 

To 

$950 

SOIL IMPROVERS I 
During Ag I this week we 

learned the parts of, and how 
to judge a cow, steer, pig, 
and a sheep. We had many 
tests over them, and I think 
everyone knows it pretty 
good. We had another test on 
Friday over the general 
appearance of them. Mr. 
Owen said that if we would 
go to contest we would 
probably place. See you next 
week. Terry Walker. 

Rising Star 
Lunch Room Menu 

Feb. 26th-Mar. 2, 1979 
Breakfast-Monday 26th 

Jelly donuts, Juice, and Milk 
Tuesday, 27th, French 

toast, Juice and Milk. 
Wednesday, 28th 

Cinnamon rolls 
Juice 
Milk 

Thursday, 1st 
Pancakes 
Sausage 
Syrup 
Juice 
Milk 

Friday, 2nd 
Scrambled eggs 
Buttered toast 
Jelly 
Juice 
Milk 
Lunch 

Monday 26th 
Steak fingers and gravy 
Green beans 
French fries 
Devil food cake 
Rolls-butter 
Tuesday 27th 
Burrito with chili and cheese 
Pork and beans 
Lettuce and tomato salad 
Crackers 
Whipped jello 

Wednesday 28th 
Spaghetti with meat sauce 
English peas 
Buttered corn 
Combination salad 
Peach cobbler 
Rolls-butter 

Thursday, 1st 
Tacos with sauce and cheese 
Lettuce-tomato salad 
Chili beans 
Pineapple up-side-down cake 

Friday 2nd 
Bar-b-q on buns 
Pickles-relish 
Onions 
Potatoes 
Cranberry crunch 
This menu is subject to 
change. Milk is served with 
all meals. 

Men And Boys Long Sleeve 

SWEAT SHIRTS 
MEN'S SHOE SALE 

Many Styles And Sizes 

Slip-Ons And Lace 

GIRLS SPORTSWEAR 
Many Styles And Colors 

Reg. SAVE 
NOW 

 

$8 	 $320 

IMPROVING 
RELATIONSHIPS 

WITH TEACHERS 
Here we are again, and we 

had our Fifties Day. It 
turned out pretty good. The 
Student Council made about 
fifty dollars on admission 
and r refreshments. Some of 
the people in FFA made 
placques for the prizes. First 
prize went to the Junior 
class, second prize went to 
the Sophomore class, and 
third prize went to the Senior 
class. Best dressed girl went 
to Barbie Rust and received 
bubble gum and pink hair 
ribbons. Best dressed guy 
went to Marc Kizer who 
received a hair comb and 
bubble gum. That's about all 
for this week. La Jean Rust 

Reg. 

'18 

To 

$39 

Reg. 

$7 

To 

'14 

BOY'S JEANS MEN'S LONG SLEEVE 

SPORTS SHIRTS 
NOW 

11/2 4 
To 	 To 

$28  PRICE $14 

Reg. 
$7 

To 

35% se 
OFF 	

$845 

Boy's And Girls 

CANVAS SHOES 
Many Styles And Colors 35%  $NOW 55  

To 
OFF $910 

MORNING HAS BROKEN 
Last week in school we 

seniors studied long hours 
for Civics and English tests, 
so our studyhalls we are 
pretty busy. 

The test in English was 
over The Canterbury Tales 
and The Pardoner's Tale. 
The test in Civics was over 
the laws of the Supreme 
Court, Court of Appeals, and 
the six special courts. 

In algebra II we had a pop 
test and it was pretty easy. 

1,1 

EAMAND • RANGER 
629-2321 647-1436 

SASTLAND COUNTY'S FAMILY STORE 
MATURING NATIONALLY ADVIRTISID 'RANDS 

Reg. 
s8  

To 

'12 

BOY'S SHIRTS 
Long Sleeve Styles NOW 

$320 

2 	To 

OFF 	$480  PRICE 



SHAMPOO 
Breck 15 Oz. 

Reg. $2i,  
Save 80° 

13  

• HAIR 
COLOR 

Breck 

9C 

59c CAN OPENER 
GE 

Electric 

No. EC 

-33 

Reg. '15" 

Save '4. 

$ 1:19 9  

WESTBEND 
Corn Popper 

Reg. '13" 
Save '4" 

$ 99 

GliVISCON 
100 

Reg. 94" 

$ 395 

CALADRYL 
LOTION 

6 Oz. Reg. sl" 

$ 13 9 

2 to 10 Cup Automatic 
Drip Coffeemaker 

FLAVO 
DRIP 

woo 

,t;ittkE'YOu altHA't.' xt TutIFS." Nit IBsoirs, 

DISCOUNT CENTER 
Sale Days Thurs. Feb. 22 Thru Sat. Feb. 24th 

Hwy. 80 East 	629.1747 
	

Eastland, Texa 

Store Hours: 9 a.m.--7p.m. Monday thru Saturday 

Whistling 
Ideal 	MR. 

MACHINE 
Reg. sir 

Save '4° 

87 
MR. MACHINE 
• Wind him up and watch Mr. Machine 

stroll across the floor 
• With his transparent body a child can 

see all the gears that make Mr. 
Machine work 

• There's also a bellows that has Mr. 
Machine whistle "This Old Man" 

SHAMP000 
Short and Sassy 

11 	Oz. 

Reg. '1'9  

Save 50' 

h011/,  
aSSY, $ 149 

LOTION Vaseline
Intensive Care 

Reg. Herbal 

Extra Strength 

10 Oz. 
i  Reg. '1'9  

Save 60' 

C 

TOOTHPASTE 

Ultra Brite 4.3 Oz. 69c 

JACKETS TAME4189Rinse

A-  
I. 	TOG- 

Boys Lined 	dip 	Cream 

Denim 

25% 
	OFF 

,SHAMPOO 
Clariol Condition 

Condition' 16 Oz. 
shampoo 

Reg. '1.9  

Save 50' 

IS 1_39 

PETROLEUM JELLY 
Vaseline 7./5 Oz. 

Reg. $127  
Save 50' 

77` 
OVFR-DRY 

SKIN 

Vaseline  

and LONGS Reg. s12' 	Conditioner 
Save '5" 	 16 Oz. 	 Childrens 

Reg. '2" 	I 	Long 
Save 60' 	 Sleeve 

$ 1 49 

:La 
Woolile 

WOOLITE 
Cold Water 

IWash 32 Oz. 

\ Reg. sr,  
Save '1" 

97 

CLEANER 
Lysol Basin, 

Tub, Tile 

17 Oz. 

Reg. '1" 

Save 40' 

ANTI-PERSPIRANT 
Secret Roll On 

2.5 Oz. 

Reg. 

Save 70' 

143 

• MR. CLEAN 

28 Oz 

$ 119  

TI-PERSPIRANT 
MEW! 
	

Right Guard Powder Dry 

Reg $1,9 

RIGHT Save 80' 
GUARD 

1 990  

CRACKERS 
Zesta 

g.eis 	Saltine 

1 Lb. 

ALARM 
CLOCK 

GE Lighted 

Dial Snooz 

No. 7373-402 Reg. '5" Save '1" 

$449  
COLORING BOOKS  

PANTY HOSE 
Ladies No. 468 

Reg. 89' 

Save 30' 

5 

KNEE HI 
HOSE 

Ladies No. 419 
Reg. 47' 
Save 41' 

3/p..  1" 

HAMILTON 
BEACH 

,1  Reg. '32" 

Steamer Cooker 

Save '10. 

JACKETS 
Ladies Denium 

No. 2113 
s I Reg. s21" 

Save '95. 

IIIIIY 
:Breck 

CLEAN 
RINSE 
8 Oz. 

Reg. slit 
Save 30' 

7 

JACKETS 
Mens 
Lined 

Denium 
No. 325 

Reg. $24" 

Save '10°  

BLOUSES 
One Assortment 

Ladies Asst. Material 

Prices and Sizes 

25% OFF 

MATERIAL 
100% Polyester 

Reg. '1" Yd. 

Save 90' 

C 
Yd.  

99 

SHAMPOO 
LE W Tegrin 2 Oz. Tube 

Reg. '1" 

Save 40' 

$ 2299 

CORN POPPER. Corn 
butters itself while it 
pops. Four quart 
capacity; fully 

automatic. Cover thin 
over for serving. 

HEARTBURN 

WESTBEND 
Whistling Tea Kettle 

Reg. '7. Save '2" 

 	$ 59 9 

PHARMACY 
Hwy. 80 East 

Eastland, Texas 

Pharmacy Hours 9 a.m. to 7 p.m. 

Greg Bennett  R. Ph.  

RUBBERMAID 
Wastebasket No. 2850 

Reg. '6" Save '2.  

24's Reg. '1" 

$149  

-UP SUITS I 
Childrens Dallas 

Cowboy 

Asst. Sizes 

25% 
OFF 

LET US FILL 
YOUR 
NEXT 

PRESCRIPTION 
Ph. 629-8211 

BAVISCON 
ANTACID Caladryl 

Spec T 
Lozenges 

sla 

Value 

79 
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Rising Star Nursing 
Center Ankvartse 
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"There must be some mistake. That's my phone number." 

•-•••••• 

There will no mistakes when you choose your personalized 

checks at First State Bank. Choose a distinctive design 

from our large selection and be sure to include you phone 

number on them. 

RISING STAR, TEXAS 78471 

Member F.D.I.C. 

EXCELLENCE IN BANKING 	PARKING 	DRIVE-IN BANKING 

GIBSON NEW SHIPMENT 

Priced at 

PACKAGE OF S 

	50c 

reds of iterr.s to our 

We have some sensational buys and 1 ots of 
w merchandise. 

We have added hund 
bey department 

We ha e a large stock of party favors and 
so pplies. 

KOXE will be broadcasting live from our 
store on Thursday, Feb. 22nd from 2 to 4 p.m. 

We have added a new line of Plastic House 
ware including waste baskets, dish pans, 
tubs, ufility pails, laundry baskets, dish drainer 
sots cannisfer sets just to name a few. 

There are many other new items in stock, 
and we invite you to come in and just browse 
if you don't need to buy. 

We would like to take this means to express 
our appreciation to our wonderful customers 
who have been faithful these 7 years. Without 
you, we would not be celebrating a 7th anni- 
versary. 

To all the newcomers we want to issue a 
special wetcome to shop with us. 

Oil Of Day 
4 OUNCE SIZE 

52.95 
OR 

2 for$5.50 

CANDLi CRAFT' 

Scud & Color 

29c 
OR 

4 for $1 

Candle Rings 	Panty Hose 

PREMAtRKED $2.00 AND $2.50 	 ONE GROUP 

1/2  Price 	 59c 

Personna 
Double 11 Razor 
WITH 2 'CARTRIDGES 

PACKAGE OF 5 Each 

69c 

MAGNETIC 

Photo Albums 

10 SHEETS 

$1.99 

facial Tissues 
200 COUNT BIZU 

69c 
oft 

2 for $1.25 

RED ROSE 

Lotion 

16 OUNCE SFZE 

$1.29 

PIRSONNA DOUBLE 110GR 

Super Platinum Chrome Blades 

SIZE 126 	 HOBNAIL -VOTIVE HOLDER • 

Fuji film 	 39c 	Scented Candle 

OR 	 5 COLORS 

3 for $1.00 	29c 

LOREAL 	 ALL 

Nail Polish 	Hair Accessories 

OUR REGULAR 99c 

Now 2 for 99c 

1/2  Price 

(PRE • MARKED) 

8X TO WITH GLA$S' 

Wood Framed Prints _ $2.25 

ALL OTHER PICTURES 

Selling at 25% Off 
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We are proud to announce 
that this week was a success. 
With all the excitement of 
the past two weeks of getting 
ready for our big Valentine 
and Birthday Party. 
Last Thursday our faithful 

volunteers arrived with an 
assortment of cakes and 
loads of sherbet punch. I 
must say we really had 
plenty to eat and a jolly good 
time. 
Our Valentine box was quite 

full of cards for everyone. 
Single Red carnations were 
presented to each Birthday 
Resident. They were Linnie 
Brashear. Snova Walker. 
Estell 	Bolding. 	Josie 
Hammonds and Mary Hord. 
Nell Maynard and Bryan 
Houston played several 
musical selections for us. 
On Wednesday February 7, 

we were entertained by the 
May Baptist Youth group. 
They brought beautiful Red 
and White place mats for our 
Residents to use on Valen-
tine's Day. 
Tuesday, February 13. Mrs. 

Hutton's Art group visited 
the Nursing Home and 
presented each resident with 
lovely homemade Valen-
tines. 
Mrs. Terry Geye, FHA 

sponsor at May brought her 
girls visiting on Wednesday. 
Feb. 14th. They brought 
Valentine's, candy and fruit 
for our beautiful people. 

The residents of Rising Star 
Nursing Center and myself 
would like to thank all these 
lovely children and their  

Thank yoa. 
"Love is" 

I will give as much as I can 
If you will show me how to 

give more then I will give 
more. 
I can only give as much as 

you need to receive or allow 
me to give. 
If you can receive all I can 

give, then my love is endless 
and fulfilled. 
If you receive a portion of 

my love, then I will give 
others the balance I am 
capable of giving. 
I must give all that I have, 

being what I am. 
LeJaan Killion, 
Activity Director 

3 Cheers for 

Sam and Neil Scott of the 
Rising Star 4-H Club 
exhibited the Reserve 
Champion Limousine steer at 
the San Antonio Livestock 
Exposition February 6-18. 
The steer was a black 

modelly-faced steer and sold 
for S1500. 
Sam's Limousine heifer was 

also named Champion 
Limousine and older brother, 
Neil had the Reserve Cham-
pion Limousine heifer. 
The two boys also showed 

the 4th place middle weight 
Limousine steer. They are 
the sons of Mr. and Mrs. 
Payton Scott of Rising Star. 

Sipe Springs 
News 

Mr. Buddy Warton and 
daughter of Midland and 
Mark of Barton of College 
Station spent last week end 
with their parents, the Ted 
Barton. 

Mts. Ruby Boswell 
returned home Wednesday 
after spending several days 
with her brothers in Whit-
ney. 

Mrs. Winnie Anderson and 
Ma Morgan visited with Mrs. 
Maggie Smith in Rising Star 
Tuesday. 

Visitors in the N. L. 
Leonard home were Mrs. 
Georgie Leonard, Janell 
Leonard both of Gorman and 
Gayle Leonard of Fort 
Worth. 

Kyle Joyce had nose 
surgery at Hendrick 
Memorial Hospital in 
Abilene on Wednesday. We 
hope for Kyle a speedy 
recovery. 

Mrs. R. D. Mitchell of New 
Castle spent Thursday with 
her sister Mrs. John 
McKeehan. 

Mrs. Twila Tate is a 
patient in the De Leon 
hospital. She had the 
misfortune of breaking her 
arm. We hope for her a 
speedy recovery. 

Mr. and Mrs. N. L. 
Leonard spent Tuesday and 
Wednesday in Temple 
visiting Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Leonard. 

Friends were saddened by 
the death of Mr. Horace 
Calloway at Cisco Wed-
nesday. Our sympathy is  

extended to the family. 
Mr. Ted Barton and 

George Leonard attended 
funeral services Friday in 
Cisco for Mr. Horace 
Calloway. 

Our sympathy is extended 
to the family of Mrs. Ressie 
Chambers of Rising Star who 
passed away Wednesday. 

Mrs. Jack Miliwee 

MAY NEWS 
On Friday, March 2. at 10 

a.m. The Ada Prentice Unit 
of the United Methodist 
Women of the May Methodist 
Church will hold one of this 
most important annual 
abserovance-The call to 
prayer and self denial. 

The major events of the 
observance include a 
description of the mission 
projects for which a special 
offering is given. It will be 
divided in half and used for 
Home Missions and over 
seas. The following Areas of 
concern will helped: 

The National offering will 
be for Deaconess and Home 
Missionary pensions. The 
overseas help will be 
directed toward develop-
ment of leadership to build a 
society when human rights 
one safe guarded. 

The last event will be in the 
form of a celebration, 
dedication, and Praise 
followed by a quiet meal in 
the Fellowship Room of the 
May Church. 

Look Who's New 
Justin Wayne 

Gaylon and Misti Merritt 
are proud to announce the 
arrival of their son, Justin 
Wayne. The little lad was 
born, Friday. February 2. 
1979 in the Brownwood 
Community Hospital at 8720 
a.m. He weighed 7 lbs. and 
11 3/4 ozs. 
Justin is also welcomed by 

his brother, Jonathan who is 
4. 
Proud grandparents are Mr. 

and Mrs. Wayne Merritt of 
Rising Star and Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl Alexander of Abilene. 
Great-grandmother is Mrs. 

J.E. Merritt of Brownwood. 

STRAIGHT FROM 
THE CHEF 

Wednesday, February 
14th, the FHA had their 
regular meeting. This 
meeting was different, 
though, because we had a 
joint meeting with the FFA. 

We also had a different 
demonstrater. By that, I 
mean, we had a man to 
speak. Mr. Owen, the Ag 
teacher, showed us how to 
decorate cakes. He did his 
own wedding cake and he 
had done several other 
cakes. This was also career 
education since many people 
make their living by doing 
this kind of work. Thank you, 
Mt. Owen_ You did a great 

The classes are all doing 
the same thing as last week. 
The Homemaking I and II 
classes are sewing, and the 
Home and Family Living 
class is still studying about 
re-decorating. 

See you next week! 
Janetta Lawrence love and sponsors for their 

6-gifts.L ehold. 
	 'ssaanaasQlatz=saistaseillaissibSIMMIIIIIL.  

One Special Group o . . 8 TRACK TAPES. . .New And Guaranteed 
$1" Each or 2 for t30° 

• 

Cross PlaihO, Discount 



Standing 

Jolly 
Van 
_Bar 

Reg. No. 868732 
'72 Sorrel Stallion 
15-2 1250 lbs. 

GRANDSON OF THREE BARS 
AND VANDY 

Also Offering Yearling And 2-Yr.-Oldi 
By Jolly Van Bar 

Bobby Rabon 
Ph. 62S-2764 	 Novice, Texas 
After 6 P.M: 

Host Committee Named For Conally Visit 
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Summer Food Program 
The food service provided 

under the summer program 
is intended to serve as a 
substitute for the National 
School Lunch and School 
Breakfast programs, for 
children who are on school 
vacation, except that it is 
primarily directed toward 
children from needy areas. 

Food service management 
companies wishing to par-
ticipate in the Summer Food 
Service Program for 
Children must register with 
the Texas Department of 
Human Resources ( TDHR) 
by March 15, 1979. 

The summer food program 
provides nutritious meals for 
children 18 years or younger 
while schools are not in 
session. 

Participating sponsors 
may contract with a food 
service management 
company to operate its 
entire food service or for the 
preparation of meals to be 
served under the program. 

A law enacted by Congress 
requires that all food service 
management companies 
involved in the summer food 
program must register with 
the responsible state agency 
( TDHR) to participate in the 
program in Texas. 

Companies desiring in- 
formation 	about 	the 
program or an application 
for registration should 
contact: 

Texas Department of 
Human Resources, Com- 
modity 	Distribution 
Division, John H. Reagan 

Austin, Texas 

Central Texas businesses 
and schools are expected to 
attend the John B. Conally 
coffee in Brownwood, Fri-
day, february 23, at 10 a.m. 
in the Brownwood coliseum. 
"Governor Conally and his 

wife, Nellie, wanted to start 
his campaign for the Repu-
blican presidential nomina-
tion in his home state," Dr. 
Guy Newman, co-chairman 
of the event, said in reveal-
ing plans for the Texas tour. 
The Connallys' will visit 
more than 20 communities 
during seven days and meet 
and greet as many fellow 
Texans as possible. 
The World War 11 veteran 

who attained the rank of Lt. 
Commander began his 40 
year political career in 1939. 
He served as Secretary of the 
Navy beCure serving as 
Governor of Texas from 1963 
to 1969. He served as Secre-
tary of the Treasury in 1971 
and 1972. He again became a 
member of Foreign Intelli-
gence Advisory Board from 
1972 to 1977, before resum-
ing his senior partnership in 
Vinson and Elkins in 
Houston in 1973. 
Newman emphasized that 

the coffee is open to every-
one - Republicans, Demo-
crats, and Independents. 

John and Nellie Connally in their Houston 

home. (Connolly is the candidate for the 

Republican nomination for President.) 

According to the U.S. Post 
Office, a postal card is one that 
has the stamp printed on it, 
a post card must be stamped. 

Building, 
78701. 

Information also may be 
obtained or registration 
application made by calling 
the Department at 512-475-
3027. 

M. L. Terrell Real Estate 
Highway 80 Phone 629-1725 

HOMES 

AWARD WINNING PECANS — Paul J. Muhle, 400 West Blanco, sorts some of 
his Western Schley pecans that placed fourth in competition at the International 
Pecan Conference in El Paso with 41 entries from Arizona, New Mexico and 
Texas. Muhle is hopeful that his award may encourage others in the area to 
grow pecans. His Kowa variety placed first among three entries. 

—Staff Photo by Jim Rawls 

4 houses close to school, in good condition. They are 
rented now. There is one 1 bedroom, two 2 bedroom, 
and one 3 bedroom. They have new all-weather siding 
and chain link fences. 
A grocery store and station with fixtures and stock 
that is doing a good business. A 3 bedroom home goes 
with this business on approximately 1 acre of land at 
Lake Leon. $45,000.00 
Near Ranger on 1-20 8 acres that would make a good 
site for a business. $25,000.00 
A 25 x 100 building with four lots that would make a 
good site for a business. There is an older home on 
one of the four lots that could be remodeled. 
$22,000.00 

tives 
1610 Longworth Building 
Washington, D.C. 20515 
Telephone: (202) 225-6605 

Minutes Of 
Meeting 

MINUTES OF MEETING 
On this the 8th day of 

February. 1979. the City 
Aldermen of the City of 
Rising Star. Texas, met in a 
called session and the follow-
ing Resolution was intro-
duced and unanimously 
passed and adopted. 

RESOLUTION 
WHEREAS, the City of 

Rising Star has need of 
certain engineering services 
necessary for the growth and 
development 	of 	the 
community, 
WHEREAS, it is the 

opinion of the above officials 
that the firm of W.F. 
SOULES & ASSOCIATES. 
INC. is a firm consisting of 
several engineers who are 
competent and capable in 
this field of work and having 
as principal members of the 
firm, Engineers registered as 
Professional Engineers in the 
State of Texas: 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT 

RESOLVED, by the City 
Council of the City of Rising 
Star, Texas, that the Mayor 
be and is hereby authorized 
and instructed to enter into a 
contractural agreement with 
the said firm for the 
Engineering services includ-
ing reports and cost esti-
mates for improvements to 
the municipally owned utility 
systems. 
BE IT FURTHER 

RESOLVED that fees for 
professional services will be 
due as provided in the 
contractural agreement. 
The above Resolution was 

introduced by Bernie Barnes, 
seconded by Weldon Lee, 
and the Mayor put same to a 
vote. The Mayor and all 
Aldermen present voted 
AYE, there being none vot-
ing NO, it was ordered to be 
entered in the minute book of 
the City of Rising Star, 
Texas. 

John W. Lee 
Mayor 

City of Rising Star, Texas 

at 2,892 to 2,900 feet, treated 
with 1,000 gallons of acid. 
The pay was fractured with 
25,000 gallons of water and 
23,000 pounds of sand. 
Operator set the 4%-inch 

casing at 2,980 feet, one foot 
off bottom. 

P.O. Box 1101 
Abilene, Texas 79604 
Telephone: (915) 673-7221 

P.O. Box 192 
Stamford, Texas 79553 
Telephone (9151  773-3623 

Oil News 
	• 

Stray Oil Co. of Burkburnett 
will drill No. 1 H. Drennan in 
Comanche County Regular 
Field. 
Location is four Miles north-

west of Sidney on a 160-acre 
lease. 
It spots 467 feet from the 

north and west lines of Lot 
20, League 3, Lampasas CSL 
Survey. 

In Eastland: 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home with new carpet, covered 
patio, garage with storage building in back. Extra lot 
goes with house. 
3 bedroom, 1 bath home that is carpeted and paneled. 
Owner will sell furnished for $21,500.00. 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home on corner lot, close to Jr. 
High and High School. $13,900,00. 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home that is carpeted, located on a 
large lot with fenced back yard. $17,000.00 
Large, nice older home on a corner lot. 3 bedrooms, 2 
baths, den with fireplace, study and formal dining 
area. $35,000.00. 
A very nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath home with den and 
fireplace. This approximately 2100 square foot home 
has built-ins and is fully carpeted. It has a large 
workshop, patio and nice trees; on approximately 4 
acres. $48,000.00. 
A large 3 bedroom, 1-1/2  bath older home that is close 
to downtown. This home is carpeted and paneled. 
$16,500.00 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home that is partially paneled and' 
carpeted. Located at Morton Valley on ap-
proximately 3 acres. $19,500.00 
2 bedroom, 1 bath older home that has a large living 
room with a fireplace. This home is fully carpeted 
and paneled. Priced at only $15,500.00 
Other Locations: 
2 bedroom, 1 bath home on approximately 1 acre, 
close to Olden. It is carpeted and really nice inside. 
There is a good water well but city water is available. 
$22,500.00 
Small 2 bedroom, 1 bath home in East part of Cisco, 
with carpet, and on corner lot. $12,000.00 
1 bedroom lake cabin at Lake Leon, with city water, 
electricity and telephone. This is on a deeded lot. 
$15,000.00 
Like new, this 3 bedroom, 2 bath two-story home has 
hardly been lived in. This is really a show place. It 
has a f ireplace and many other extras inside and out. 
This 2350 square foot home is in a good location at 
Lake Leon and priced at $72,000.00 
A real nice 2 bedroom, 2 bath home that is total 
electric and one of the best locations at Lake Leon. 
$65,000.00 
2 bedroom frame home on large deeded lot at Lake 
Leon that is carpeted and has a fireplace. $55,00.00 
2 bedroom frame home on large deeded lot at Lake 
Leon that is carpet, pecan orchard and is on 
pavement. 
3 bedroom, 1 bath home on two lots. This home is 
fully carpeted and has central heat. There is an extra 
house in back that is 2 rooms and bath. Very large 
double garage that would be ideal for a shop. Located 
in Cisco. $23,500.00 
2 bedroom, 1 bath older home that has new siding but 
does need repair on the inside. Located in Ranger. 
$10,000.00 
3 homes close to downtown Ranger. All are fully 
carpeted and have been completely remodeled. 
$36,000.00 for all three or will sell separately. 

LOTS AND SMALL ACREAGE 
41 acres near Lake Leon with city water, on 

pavement. No improvements. 
Approximately 31 acres with house and barns. This 
place in intersects two highways. City water and 
water well. $35,000.00 
7 acres in good location in Cisco with city water, road 
frontage on four sides. Ideal building site. $15,000.00 
2 to 5 acre tracts at lake Leon with city water, 
electricty 'and telephone. Ideal building sites. 
1 to 5 acre tracts on Hiway 80 East or 1-20. Ideal for 
commercial or residential. $5,000.00 and up. 
5 lots located on South Bassett in Eastland. A real 
good buy at only $4,000.00 
A very large corner lot located on South Bassett, 
approximately 1/2  acre. $10,000.00 
Good size lots located in Olden. Mobil home or 
building sites. Only $2,800.00 each. 
31 acres on pavement near Lake Leon with city 
water, electricty and telephone. Good building site. 
$21,000.00 

Hammock Engineering Inc. 
of Dallas will drill No. 1 
Tra-week as a proposed 
2,300-foot wildcat in Brown 
County. 
Location is three miles 

southeast of Bangs on a 
176-acre lease. 
It spots 660 feet from the 

north and east lines of C.J. 
Carrier Survey 60. 

Sers Oil & Gas Inc. of 
Brownwood spotted No. 1 
Smith in the regular field two 
miles east of Thrifty. 
Slated for 2,500 feet from 

the north and 5,000 feet from 
the east lines of Section 16, 
HT&B Survey. 
The lease is composed of 

100 acres. 

Location for a proposed 
2,800-foot venture was 
staked in the Beattie (Marble 
Falls) Field four miles north-
east of Beattie. 

It is Annie Mae Woodruff of 
Proctor No. 1 Smith, located 
on a 160-acre lease. 
Drillsite is 1,500 feet from 

the north and 2,055 feet from 
the east lines of Section 19, 
Block 2, H&TC Survey. 

L.C. Brister, operating from 
Cisco, will drill No. 2 High-
tower in Eastland County 
Regular Field. 
Location is four miles south 

of Ranger on a 104-acre 
lease. 
It spots 4,434 feet from the 

north and 150 feet from the 
east lines of William Van 
Norman Survey, A-565. 

Proposed depth is 2,000 
feet. 

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 

Overly Operating Co. of San 
Antonio will drill No. 1 M.E. 
Daniel in the Dead Horse 
Creek (Cisco) Field five miles 
northeast of Carbon. 
Slated for 1.500 feet, it 

spots 1,650 feet from the 
south and 330 feet from the 
west lines of Section 21, 
Block 3, H&TC Survey. 

North American Explora-
tion Co. of Abilene 
completed No. 1 Fuller-Hen-
derson in the Gorman 
(Ranger) Field three miles 
north of Gorman in Eastland 
County. 
Location is 1,541 feet from 

the north and 295 feet from 
the west lines of W.M. 
Thompson Survey, A-1815. 
Daily potential was 29 

barrels of 40 gravity oil, plus 
35 barrels of water. It is 
pumping from perforations 

FARMS AND RANCHES 
650 acres on Sabanna River with pecan trees and 
some cultivation. Terms can be arranged. $325 per 
acre. 
612 acres located near Lake Leon with large 2 
bedroom home, on pavement, with 174 acres 
cultivation, good fences, good pens and barn. One-
half minerals. $350 per acre. 
546 acres Northwest of Eastland with 3/4  mile high-
way frontage, 9 tanks, water well. city water, 180 
acres cultivation and a 5 room house with fireplace. 
$325 per acre 
415 acres located Southwest of Ranger with deer and 
turkey. On Colony Creek. $300 per acre. 
395 acres located on Ranger-Morton Valley highway 
with good fences, some coastal and love grass. 
326 acres Northwest of Ranger, approximately 80 
acres cultivation, house, good barns, and set of pens. 
One-half minerals. $375 per acre. 
161 acres Northwest of Ranger with 60 acres coastal, 
20 acres love grass, and balance in KR bluestem and 
side oats, 2 good tanks, and good fences. No minerals, 
$375 per acre 
154 acres Southwest of Carbon with 4 tanks, 100 acres 
coastal, good barn, and older house. Will take 20 
percent down and carry 10 years. $450 per acre. 
152 acres near 1-20 and Olden with city water, elec-
tricity and telephone available. 
143 acres located Northwest of Ranger with 55 acres 
peanuts, 6 irrigation wells, and some minerals, 
$55,000.00 
125 acres 5 miles Northwest of Gorman with 53 acres 
cultivation, 53 acres peanuts, and balance in pasture 
that has been cleared and reseeded in Blusestem. 
$600 per acre 
210 acres North of Eastland on pavement, with ap-
proximately 60 acres cultivation_ Good building site. 
$295 per acre. $14,000.00 down, owner will finance. 

Rental property! We have 2 large brick duplexes for 
sale. All are 2 bedroom, 11/2  bath that are fully car-
peted, stove included. No problem staying rented. 
Only 11/2  years old and have 110 square feet in each 
side. 
One 2 bedroom duplex, fully carpeted, with stove, 
storage room, disposal and carport. Approximately 2 
years old. Stays rented, has 900 square feet in each 
side. Only $45,000.00 

We Have Other Listings 
Large and Small 

All Listings Will Be Appreciated. 
Office Phone 629-1725 
Hiway 80 East 
Eastland, Texas 76448 

M. L. Terrell 
Broker 

Home 629.2443 

Pat Maynard 
Associate 
Home 629-8063 

Helen Bradford 
Associate 

Office 647-3230 
Home 647.192i 

CONGRESSIONAL 
COMMENT 

WASHINGTON, D.C.--The 
main responsibility of a 
Congressman is to represent 
the best interests of the 
people who elected him. To 
do this requires the wearing 
of many hats and the perfor-
mance of a myriad of 
services. So that you will 
have a better idea of just 
what kind of assistance we 
can offer you, we have 
prepared a list with the name 
of employees in Washington, 
D.C. Office and have 
provided information as to 
the type of help they can 
provide. 
LOIS AUER is my legisla-

tive assistant. Her work 
involves drafting new legisla-
tion in the District's interest 
and keeping me informed of 
the status of pending legisla-
tion. She also researches and 
responds to incoming letters 
pertaining to governmental 
affairs. Previously, Lois 
worked for Mr. Burleson for 
51/2  years as legislative aide. 

ROCCHINA CASALE came 
to Washington in September 
1977, to work on the staff of 
Omar Buleson, hwere she 
was employed until his 
retirement in January of this 
year. At that time, she began 
working for me. Her duties 
include basic secretarial and 
stenographic work, along 
with varied case work. 

JUDY CURTIS, Administra-
tive Assistant, served in the 
same capacity for Congress-
man Omar Burleson. Having 
worked for Mr. Burleson for 
the past 23 years, she has a 
wide acquaintance with the 
33-county 17th Congres-
sional District. Judy is 
responsible for 'the overall 
managment of the office, 
workload and production, 
staff management, coordina-
tion with the District offices, 
establishment of office objec-
tives, and assignment of 
projects. 
ROBERT DYER recently 

moved to Washington from 
Cisco, Texas, where he 
previously worked as a 
farmer-rancher. He is a 
graduate of Hardin Simmons 
University with a degree in 
mathmatics. He brings with 
him an extensive knowledge 
of two key industries of the 
17th District--energy and 
agriculture. Bob is serving as 
my adviser for energy related 
matters. 
JOHN HAUGEN works on 

Social Security, Medicare, 

welfare, and related matters. 
He previously served on the 
staff of Omar Burleson for 
21/2  years. 
SONNY LEE of Snyder, 

Texas, is my press assistant 
as well as adviser on foreign 
affairs and foreign agricul- 
ture. He is a graduate of 
Western Texas College and 
is presently attending 
American University School 
of International Service, 
where he is a Presidential 
Scholar. 

JAMES MORGAN from De 
Leon, Texas, has worked as 
both lawyer and a farmer. He 
has received a B.S. degree 
from Tarleton State in Agri-
cultural Education, an M.S. 
degree from Texas A&M in 
Agricultural Economics, and 
a law degree from the 
University of Texas. He will 
use his extensive knowledge 
and experience as my 
agricultural adviser. 
MADELINE SCHNEIDER, 

Typist, works on typing pro-
jects, having worked for 
Congressman Burleson in 
the same capacity. 
CAROL ANN SENTENA is 

a native of Abilene, Texas, 
where she graduated from 
Abilene High School in 1973 
and received a B.A. in Politi-
cal Science from Hardin 
Simmons University. She is 
involved in secretarial duties 
and 	responding 	to 
constituent requests. 

CLAUDIA SIPE, Executive 
Secretary, has worked on 
Capitol Hill for approxima-
tely 26 years; 22 of these 
years have been spent work-
ing for former Members of 
the Texas Delegation. 
Among the myriad of tasks 
which she performs are 
assisting constituents with 
military and veterans 
problems together with 
handling telephone requests. 
KEN WALTER, from 

Abilene, Texas, previously 
worked as an aide to Omar 
Burleson. He has a B.A. 
degree in accounting from 
Texas Tech University and is 
a Certified Public Accoun-
tant. Ken is an assistant 
legislative assistant. His 
duties include working on 
matters dealing with the Post 
Office and Civil Service 
Committee and 
tbunsisn.ess-government raellsao- io  

A Congressional office is 
moving on a number of 
planes. At any given time, 
we (Congressman and his 
staff) can be involved in 
formulating a legislative idea 
and drafting a bill, respond-
ing to constituent requests, 
handling casework, and 
attending committee meet-
ings. 1 believe I have a staff 
that is capable and certainly 
willing to assist you when-
ever you need help dealing 
with your government. 
If you feel that you need 

assistance please do not hesi-
tate to contact one of my 
three Congressional offices: 

U.S. House of Representa- 
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629-1781 
WHY HAVEN'T YOU CALLED US-on this beautiful 

brick htme located in Eastlands finest neighborhood-3 
br., 2 baths-Large family room with fireplace, unique 
kitchen with built-ins, Double garage with excellent 
storage and a handy shop with 220 wiring-Owners 
waiting to-Don't you wait to call-Reduced price 
$49,900.00 

LARGE GRACIOUS FAMILY HOME-3 bedrooms, 2 
baths, fireplace, large kitchen with built-ins, corner 
lot, custom drapes, Immediate possession, A Nice 
Home for $42,800.00. 

ARE YOU WAITING TO MOVE TO THE COUN-
TRY-There will never be a better time than now with 
this attractive home available to you-4 acres, rough 
cedar exterior, central heat and air in addition to the 
cozy fireplace, shop, water well and city water, Ideal 
location-Appraised at $48,000.00. 

MAKE US AN OFFER-3 br., 1 bath home situated on 
5 acres, Well kept-Stay comfortable with central heat 
and air, Plenty of storage and a shop-Call Today-
Asking 36,900.00. 

COMFORTABLE AND INVITING-3 bedroom and 
1 1/2  baths-corner lot, red brick, formal dining, break- 
fast room, service porch, 4 ton central heat and air-
new shop building-Handy to schools-See Today-
$33,500.00. 
BEAUTIFUL-OAK TREES--Surround this attractive 

3 bedroom, 1 barn home, Situated on two lots, chain-
link fence, double garage, warm pine paneling and 
cabinets-Available for $1000.00 cash down-Asking 
$33,500.00. 

ARE YOU READY TO MOVE YOUR BUSINESS 
CLOSER TO HOME-Then we have what you are 
looking for in this newly listed 3 bedroom home in 
Cisco-Beauty Shop and storage, 21/2  lots, covered patio, 
central heat and air-Call Us Today-129,500.00. 

COUNTRY BARGAIN-3 acres, lots of potential, 
carpet, seperate dining, paneling, good fences-Call 
For An Appointment—$19,500.00 SELL YOUR WIFE-
On this cozy 2 br. home in Gorman-2 blocks from 
hospital and rest home, 1/2  acre, water well-Call for 
More Information-$19,500.00. 

ARE YOU LOOKING FOR AN OUTSTANDING 
BUY-Then look now more-We have a comfortable 2 
bedroom home that sounds like you-Cozy dining room 
with fireplace, fenced back yard, garage and storage, 
What a Buy-What a Price $1000.00 cash-down payment 
$18,500.00. 

LAKE PROPERTY DON'T WORRY ABOUT FINANCING on this 3 
bedroom house, 1300 sq. ft., 5 lots, nice remote location 
for a garden or orchard. Owner financing, 20 percent 
down. $15,500. 

EFFICIENT IS THE WORD for this small house in 
Ranger near downtown. Stove, refrigerator, & 
evaportive cooler included, washer-dryer hookup. 
Great starter at this price $7,500. 

IT'S A BEAUTY of a mobile home with 2 large lots in 
Ranger. 14 x 80, 3 bedroom 11/2  baths, 2 years old, rock 
underpining, furniture included. Beautiful location, 
chain link fence, get into this for a low down payment, 
& take up payments. $15,000. 

BUY NOW-FOR LATER-and enjoy a good water 
front in this one bedroom cabin on Lake Leon. Large 
family room, seperate dining room, leased lot, fenced 
yard-$22,000.00. 

ENJOY EASY LIVING AT THE LAKE-in this one 
oedroom cabin, large screened-in porch, partially 
furnished, BBQ. pit, large deeded lot-$16,000.00 

LAKE CABIN-Located on a fishing nook at Lake 
Leon. Small house completly furnished, boat dock-Not 
far from Country Club-a good Weekender for 
$10,000.00. 

THIS IS THE PERFECT CHANCE FOR YOU-To 
buy a good house at a good price-Neat 2 bedroom 
home-new siding, excellent neighborhood, Roomy 
kitchen, nice yard, even a garden spot-Check this out 
before looking elswhere-$18,500.00. 

MAKE A TRADE FOR THIS 2 BEDROOM HOUSE 
IN CISCO—Good neighborhood, paneled, carpet, large 
living room, fenced, lots of fruit trees, excellent 
garden space-Owner would consider mobile home or 
lake property in trade-$17,500.00. 

KNOW A BARGAIN WHEN YOU SEE ONE—You 
will in this 3 bedroom frame with 1 acre in Cisco, In 
good repair, fresh paint, ready to move into. Carpet, 
roomy kitchen with pretty wood cabinets. Fenced with 
barn-Ready for you and your horse-Priced for quick 
sale-$17,000.00. 

EXTRA INCOME POTENTIAL-3 or 4 bedroom 
house on corner lot with 6 mobile home spaces, 
comfortable house, good neighborhood, all carpet 
except utility room, fruit trees-A Working man's Home 
at A Thinking Man's Price-$17,000.00. 

LOOKING FOR A WAY TO BEAT HIGH RENTAL 
PRICES-Then check out this large 3 bedroom home in 
Eastland-Convenient to schools, nice size rooms, 
wonderful potential-Pay equity and assume low 
monthly payments of $101.00. 

REMODELING EXPERT NEEDED-For this 10 
room, 2 story house in Gorman. Great potential with 3 
bedrooms, 2 baths downstairs-3 rooms upstairs. 
Priced right at $10,000.00. 

MEET THE DEMAND FOR RENT PROPERTY-
with this duplex in Eastland-Three bedrooms on one 
side, 2 on the other-needs some repair, but rentable-
Asking $7990.00. 

START THE NEW YEAR OFF RIGHT-in our newly 
listed 2 bedroom home paneling-Don't Let This Pass 
You By-$16,500.00. 

ECONOMY MINDED-Small 2 bedroom house in 
Eastland. Lots of kitchen cabinets, fenced back yard-
$12,950.00. 

COME SEE THIS-spacious older home in Ranger, 
completely renovated, 6 bedrooms, 2 baths, new built 
ins, new bath fixtures, central heat & air, insulation, 
2300 sq. ft. You'll love the new look and the old charm, 
owner financing. Be sure to see this for $40,000. 

LOTS AND SMALL ACREAGE 
JUST WHAT YOU ARE LOOKING FOR 5 acres 

near Colony, lovely rural homesite, close to both 
Eastland & Ranger, pecan trees, natural gas on site, 
water well, ideal location for home. Owner finance, 20 
percent down, $8,500. 

CORNER LOT IN EASTLAND on paved streets, 
large trees, close to schools, Nice business or 
homesite. $1,800. 

2 FENCED LOTS with scattered oak trees. Small 
shed with horse pen, Nice building site or ready for a 
horse. 

16 LOTS IN CISCO, close to 1-20. Good investment or 
development property, needs some leveling. Owner 
finaincing available. $4,500. 

S ACRES ON EDGE OF EASTLAND 2 tracts to 
choose from. Large mature pecan trees, coastal 
bermuda, creek bottom, city water. Pretty place to 
live $7,500. 

12 ACRES IN CISCO Street frontage on Lake Bernie 
road, ready to be improved, city water, 1/4  minerals, 
will divide, make us an offer. Asking $1,000 acre. 

14 ACRES ON 1-20 Large pecan trees, Leon River 
bottom, great potential, owner financing with 10 
percent down, Asking $900. acre. 

20 ACRES SOUTH OF CISCO, Scenic, scattered 
trees, west-bound water, Ideal for building or mobile 
home, flexible terms or financing, Asking $600 acre. 

46 ACRES-BOSQUE COUNTY-Some cultivation, 
Timber, native grasses, pecan orchard, 1 tank, some 

minerals, Basque River runs thru property Owner will 
consider financing-Call for Details. 

50.1 CARES-LEON RIVER RUNS THRU-2 tanks, 
water well, i barn, small one bedroom-partly fur-
nished house, 4% miles south of Cisco. $850.00 per acre. 

60 ACRE PEANUT FARM-1 mile off highway, 25 
acre peanut allotment, water well. Will sell all or sub-
divide-$620.00 per acre. 

85 ACRES PRIME GRASSLAND-3 miles N. E. of 
Eastland-Good fences, Old house, 2 small barns, 2 
tanks, Possible owner finance-$565.00 per acre. 

100 ACRES-All improved grassland-Carbon area-
barn, good fences, stock tanks, all coastal and love 
grass. Asking $495.00 an acre. 

120 TREE-COVERED ACRES-Located approx. 7 
miles southeast of Eastland, V2 minerals, fenced, good 
Deer hunting, owner financing available-offered at 
$375.00 an acre. 

130 ACRES-STRAWN AREA-Ideal hunting-small 
house-rolling hills, Perfect Hideway-Owner finance-
$365.00 an acre. 

288 ACRES-S. of Cisco-Excellent hunting, lots of 
trees, some open land, 3 stock tanks, good fences, 
owner would consider splitting. Some minerals. 
Asking 8325.00 an acre. 

880 ACRES-EASTLAND COUNTY-Excellent hun-
ting, good water wells, stock tanks, Ultra-Senic-Invest 
or terms with owner financing. Priced well below 
average land prices. Ideal combination Ranch, 
Recreation, Investment property. 

OPEN MON-SAT 
We have many other listings 

FHA-VA-CONVENTIONAL FINANCING 
on ranches, motels, and apartments. We want to SELL your listings. 

Mike Parsons 817429.2754 	 Beryl McKinnentey 817-629-8429 
Diane Bowers 817-647-3127 	 Eddie Kincaid 817-629-1837 

Myra Lowrance 817429-1671 
Jay Stagg: 817429-1396 
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Thursday, February 22, 1979 

TO THE FRIENDS OF FRED BRIZENDINE 
The family of Fred Brizendine wish to extend their thanks 

and sincere appreciation to the many friends of Fred and Sadie 

for all the kindness and generosity shown them over the past years. 

We deeply regret that many . 
of Fred's friends were not given the 

opportunity to pay their last respects following his death on 

Saturday, February 10th. Events happened too fast and were 

beyond the control of the members of his family that had planned 

memorial services in Rising Star. 
Again thanks and May God Bless each and every one of you. 

The Brizendine Family 
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churches of Christ salute 
you" (Romans 16:16). Have 
a very pleasant week. 

Mike Wiggins, 
Minister 
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Ladies Bible 

Class Meets 

FROM OUR CHURCHES 
Church 

Of 
Christ  

sins? The Sermon Sunday 
morning will be "Lead Us." 
The Evening message will be 
on the development of 
Christianity. We will have a 
Ash Wednesday service at 
5:30 p,m. on February 28th. 
We will have a Worship 
service at 5:30 p.m. each 
Wednesday through Easter. 
May you be aware of God's 
many blessings is my prayer. 

Bill Easley 
Pastor 

First Baptist 
Chin ca 

by the hand of Almighty 
God. When Adam saw the 
blood of that innocent lamb 
staining the soil of the earth, 
it was his first experience to 
know what it meant to die 
because of sin. So the story 
of atonement and sacrifice 
begins and unfolds through-
out the word of God until 
finally in glory we shall see 
great throngs of the saints 
who have washed their robes 
and made them white in the 
blood of the Lamb. This is 
"The Scarlet Thread of 
Redemption." Our LORD's 
redemptive work for us is 
three-fold. One, it is closely 
associated with forgiveness 
since we receive forgiveness 
through the redemptive price 
of Christ's death. Two, it 
involves justification since 
the deliverance establishes 
us in a restored position of 
favor before God. Three, it 
promises final deliverance 
from the power of sin at the 
coming of the LORD. This 
redemption is "The Scarlet 
Thread." 

Myrtle Owen 

MARCH 1 
Tony Long 
John Schlinker 
Kimberly Harris 
Billy Harmon 
W.B. Hastings 
MARCH 2 
Douglas Walker 
Christi Clark 
MARCH 3 
Mike Fraley 
Lynda Ford 
Ludene Michael 
Faye Brush 
Dona Killion 
Jesse Hurst 
Ralph Martin 
MARCH 4 
Lillie Alford 
Jake Somerford 
Charlie Tyler 
Annie Ruth Christian 
Paul Fullerton 
Jean Wilson 

FEBRUARY 23 
Lue Watkins 
Jerrilyn Winfrey 
Jo Lynn Butler 
Jeff Rust 
FEBRUARY 24 
Olena Ezzell 
Mary Perkins 
Snova Walker 
Edith Bibb 
Vickie Elliott 
FEBRUARY 25 
Cleo White 
James Wolf 
Darlene Maynard 
Opal HiJl 
Deddie Chambers 
Bob Ford 
Evelyn Denham 
FEBRUARY 26 
Mary (Cain) Beard 
FEBRUARY 27 
Debbie Linney 
Estella Hudson 
Rex Hudson 
Nancy Winchester 
FEBRUARY 28 
Ozzie Burns 
Gary Jones 
Mrs. Ida Montgomery 
FEBRUARY 29 
Gary Hubbard 

First United 
Methodist 

Chunk 
Near New York City there is 

a cemetery where there is a 
grave which has inscribed 
upon its headstone just one 
word "Forgiven." There is 
no name, no date of birth or 
death. The stone is plain with 
just the one word, "For-
given." Can you think of 
anything greater that could 
be put on your headstone 
than "Forgiven?" The 
languate spoken in heaven 
by the angels and the 
frdeemed is the language of 
forgiveness. It will be the 
only languate spoken there. 
No other language will be 
understood. It will be spoken 
by the cherubim and the 
other seraphim and the 
whole angelic host as they 
praise God, the author of 
forgiveness and of eternal 
salvation. It will be spoken 
by all the redeemed as they 
greet one another on the 
banks of the River of Life and 
gather round the throne of 
the Lamb and sing their song 
unto him who loved them and 
washed them from their sins. 
But no one can learn that 
language after he gets to 
heaven. It must be learned 
upon earth-in this world, and 
in this life. That is what 
Jesus taught us when he 
taught us to pray, "Forgive 
us our debts, as we forgive 
our debtors." Have you 
repented of your sins? Have 
you received forgivness of 
God through Christ for your 

Fifteen ladies of the Church 
of Christ were encouraged 
February 14 by talks given by 
the ladies. Lolene Claborn 
talked on Jealousy and its 
effects on the family; Eleanor 
Nunnally spoke on the fruit 
of the Spirit as the reverse of 
the works of the flesh; Jackie 
Le Bleu discussed the quali-
ties of love of I Corinthians 
13; La Verne Carroll gave a 
talk on Sarah's jealousy for 
Hagar, and Velma Le Bleu 
told us how Ruth and Naomi 
were truly not jealous. Gett-
ing rid of jealousy and envy 
will help one be a better 
"keeper of his brother." 
Cindy Wiggins led the Bible 

drill and Carol Goode led the 
sining. Sula Harris led the 
opening prayer and Jeannine 
Bailey closed the meeting 
with a prayer. 
Others present were Irene 

Landreth, Jaci Tischler, 
Mary Carroll, Inez Elliott, 
Eloise Lipsey, and Ruth 
Murphy. All ladies are 
invited to attend each Wed-
nesday morning at 9:30. 

Jane Fullerton 
Jetta Darr 
MARCH 5 
Ann Merritt 
Bill Carpenter 
Delbert Green 
Richard Pennell 
MARCH 6 
Alta Agnew 
Ruby Darnell 
Erma Hudnall 
George Webb 3rd 
Opal Boyd 
Ricky Ware 
Butch Spencer 
Joe McCary 
MARCH 7 
Sharon Pennell 
Weldon Griffith 
Charles Glen Carroll 
Jason Edward Pernell 

have a 
nice weekend... 

The Scarlet Thread; The 
Creation and the fall. When 
God made the heavens and 
the earth, they must have 
been beautiful, perfect, and 
pure. In the Garden of Eden, 
however, through a denial of 
the Word of God and through 
a deception of the woman, 
our first parents fell. Eve was 
decieved. but Adam chose to 
die by the side of the woman 
whom God had created and 
placed in the Garden with 
him. When the Lord came to 
visit the man and his wife in 
the cool of the day, He could 
not find them. They were 
afraid and hid themselves 
from the Lord because they 
were naked and ashamed. To 
hide their guilt, they made 
for themselves aprons of fig 
leaves, but when God looked 
upon the covering, He said, 
This will not do." Covering 
for sin (atonement for sin) 
cannot be woven by human 
hands. Therefore, some-
where in the Garden of Eden, 
the Lord took an innocent 
animal, and before the eyes 
of Eve and Adam, God slew 
that innocent animal as the 
ground drank up its blood. 
This the beginning of "The 
Scarlet Thread of Redemp-
tion." Through the slaughter 
of an innocent victim, God 
took coats of skin and 
covered over the shame and 
the nakedness of the man 
and his wife. This is the first 
sacrifice, and it was offered 

AUCTION 
Saturday 10:30 A.M. 

Man seems to always be 
headed away from God and 
has to be called to repen-
tance. From the very beginn-
ing of time, the Bible tells us 
that man over and over 
departs from God's revealed 
will to do what man thinks is 
best for him. Adam and Eve 
disobeyed God. Their son 
Cain even got so angry with 
his brother that he killed 
him. Why? Because God 
respected Able's offering 
and did not respect Cain's. 
When Jesus was on the earth 
he taught the truth. It was 
not what people's religious 
leaders wanted to hear. They 
killed Jesus at the hands of 
the Romans. Why? Why did 
they not repent and listen to 
God's word? 
There seems to be some-

thing about religion that 
makes people either faithful 
to God or against God's 
people. Why is that? Why 
will some people try to obey 
God as best they can and 
others stand off and make 
fun of their faith? And if the 
ones who insist on having 
their own religion instead of 
the one God revealed get 
angry, why do they get angry 
with the ones who are 
humbly trying to serve God? 
Why did Cain kill Able 
instead of doing something 
to God? Able ws only trying 
to obey God. Why did the 
Jews' priests and religious 
leaders try to kill Jesus? He 
was only giving them God's 
word. 
I believe Jesus gave us the 

answer to these questions in 
John 15:18, 19. There he 
says, "If the world hate you, 
ye know that it hated me 
before it hated you. If ye 
were of the world, the world 
would love his own: but 
because ye are not of the 
world, but 1 have chosen you 
out of the world, therefore 
the world hateth you." 
Christian, take heart because 
you are counted worthy to be 
persecuted in the Name of 
Christ. Glorify God. Jesus 
said in Matthew 5:12 that we 
are to rejoice and be exceed-
ing glad because great is our 
reward in heaven. "The 

Save on these '78 mowers while they last!!! 

I can remember being 
thirsty but a few times in my 
life. Chopping beans on a hot 
summer day will make a kid 
want a lot of cool water. 
Thirst will make people do 

many things they normally 
will not do. The person who 
craves another drink 'of 
alcohol will under certain 
circumstances fight to get it. 
The whole life pattern is 
altered when the thirst is 
intense. 
The Psalmist speaks of his 

thirst. "0 God, thou art my 
God, early will I seek thee; 
my soul thirsteth for thee, 
my flest longeth for thee in a 
dry and thirsty land, where 
no water is." (Psalm 63:1) 
Many Christian thirst for an 

expanded knowledge of 
God's Word, a fuller expres-
sion of the love of Christ, a 
richer fellowship with other 
christians, a deeper com-
munion with Christ. 
"As the hart (deer) panteth 

after the water brooks, so my 
soul after thee, 0 God." 
(psa. 42:1) 
Our Lord said, "Blessed are 

they who do hunger and 
thirst...for they shall be 
filled." (Matthew 5:6) 
When thirst is excruciating 

enough it will drive one to 
alter his life-style to be 
satisfied. 
Some christians seeking to 

satisfy this hunger are called 
fanatical because their life-
style is so radically different 
than other people. No doubt, 
most of us should become 
more committed. 
Normal hunger and thirst 

will result in adopting a way 
of life which is comfortable, 
health building and fulfilling. 
Normal hunger and thirst 

surly would demand of the 
christian to see that time is 
spent in prayer and reading 
God's word each day; time is 
spent in the regular 
assembly of Christians on 
Sundays and Wednesdays 
for Bible study and prayer; 
time and energy is expended 
to live a clean, moral, upright 
life each day at home, in 
school, and in the commu—
nity. 
Sunday Morning message: 

"You Can Take Charge of 
Your life." 
Sunday Evening message: 

"The Oneness of the Church, 
the Body of Christ." 

R.D. Williams, 
Pastor 

Two Local Youths 

Named On Tech 

Honor Roll 
139.95 (3) 84

. 
95(not shown) 

17203 Horsepower 20" 
149.95 (4) 

7722V 31/2  horsepower 22" 
self propelled 
-4 cylce. Easy spin vertical 
pull starter. Engine 
shroud. 

-14 ga. steel. Fully baffled. 
Side chute. 

-wheels: 
-handle: 7/8 heavy "Loop" 
chrome tubular steel. 

-drive: roller chain, direct 
drive to front axle. Drive 
sprocket engages front 
tires. 

-cutting height: 11/2 " to 3". 

Instant "Select-a-Cut" all RB 2177 31/2  horsepower 
four wheels. 	 21" 

-controls: on handle. Lever Nine position finger tip 
controls start, stop, and 	height adjusters. 
speed. Rod controls self- Easy verticle pull start 
propelling drive. 	 chute cover closes auto-

-finish-deck phosphatized, matically when grass 
chromic acid etched, 	catcher is removed. 
undercoated, baked-on 
metallic enamel finish. 
Flamboyant green with 
dove white trim. 

February 24 1979 
JOE BUTLER FARM 

RISING STAR, TEXAS 
Located 1 mile on Cross Plains Hwy. (Hwy. 36). 
Then 1 mile south. And then 1 mile west. Watch 
for AUCTION signs. 

"REDUCING FARMING OPERATIONS" 
This is a Sell-Down of Farm equipment consisting of: 

I.H.C. "1466" Diesel Tractor w-Cab, Air, Full weights, 

Factory Duals, Dual Hydraulics (2200 hrs.) 

John Deere "1530" Diesel Tractor w-1800 hrs. 
1973-Chevrolet "C65" w-427 Engine, 13 speed Roadranger, 

Twin Screw & Low mileage 
1973-40' Fontaine Tandem Trailer w-grain boards & trap 

doors 

1965-Chevrolet 1 ton w-new 10' Flat bed 
1962-Chevrolet 2 Ton Truck w-20' Factory bed 
1964-Dodge 2 ton truck 

Lilliston "6000" Peanut combine 
6 row "Peorman" Invertor peanut Digger 
2 row "Lilliston" Peanut Digger 

(2) K M C 2 row invertor Peanut diggers 
6 row "Brillion" 3 pt. Conventional Cultivator 

w-Independent Guage wheels 
6 row "Top Line" 3 pt. Lime Spreader 

6 row "Lilliston" Rolling cultivator w-guage wheels 
John Deere Conventional 4 row 3 pt. Cultivator w-gunge 

wheels 
John Deere 11 shank double tool bar chisel plow 
1976-"7100 Series" 6 row planter w-Herbicide attachments 
John Deere 5 BT. 3 pt. 16" Moldboard 
John Deere Semi-Mount 5 Bt, Moldboard 
"Bushhog" 28' Fold-up Field Cultivator 
(2) John Deere 16-8 grain drills 
Double Groin Drill Hook-up 
John Deere "220" 22' wheel type fold-up Tandem Disc 

w-dual gunge wheels 
John Deere side delivery rake 
(1) set border disc w-tool bar 
Single bar coil spring chisel plow 
1,000 gal. Nurse Tank (Trailer Mounted) 
300 gal. overhead fuel tank 
welding bed for a 1 ton truck 

Plus Electric winch, Busters, Sweeps, Foot Pieces and 
other farm related items too numerous to list. 

For further information contact: Joe Butior-Ownor-817-643-4002-
Rising Star, Tex. 

COL. TEX HERRING 
(LIC. No. TXS-01O-0258) 

(FULL TIME AUCTIONEER) 
PH. 915483-2244 

P. 0. BOX 55 LAWN, TEXAS 79530 
7-2TC' 

94.95(1) 

Editor's Note: This list may 
not be complete. Because of 
state privacy laws, we 
cannot release hometown 
stories about students unless 
we receive their permission. 
Many do not give us this 
permission. Others often list 
Lubbock as their permanent 
mailing address when they 
really are natives of other 
cities and towns. This in-
formation may help you 
answer questions from 
parents whose honored 
students are not listed. 

More than 4,000 students at 
Texas Tech University 
qualified for the deans' 
honor rolls in the six colleges 
during the fall semester. 

Among them were two 
from Rising Star. 

William A. Murphree RI 2, 
James L. Simonton Rt. 2, 
Box 130. 

To qualify for a dean's 
honor roll a student must 
have a grade point average 
of 3.0 or more on a 4.0 scale 
and must have taken as 
many as 12 semester hours 
of work. 

Texas Tech University has 
enrollment of more than 
22,000 students in six 
colleges; Agricultural 
Sciences, Arts and Sciences, 
Business Administration, 
Education, Engineering and 
Home Economics. There 
also are a Graduate School 
and a School of Law. 

3902 31/2  horsepower 20" 
-fingertip select-a-cut 
-ball bearing steel wheels 
-fully baffled deck 
-3.5 hp Briggs & Stratton 
engine 

-baked on enamel finish 
-automatic choke 

109.95(2) 
3922 & 4722 31/2  horsepower 
22" (same features as 3902) 

MAGNA TILLER 
S horsepower chain drive 
Model C-28R5 
-Engine: 5 Hp. Briggs and 
Stratton easy-spin recoil 
starter, oil foam air 
cleaner. 
-Throttle: Remote throttle 
on handle panel. 

-Tines: 14" Slasher. 
Expandable 26" to 28". 

-Reverse: Full power 
reverse from engine 
auxiliary power take-off 
No twisted belts. 

-Transmittion: Heavy 

stamper steel. 
-Stabilizer: Swinging of 
fixed position with hold-up 
adjustable stake. 

-Controls: Rod type with 
stick shift on the handle 
panel for ease of operation. 

289.95 
NEED FURNITURE? 

Visit Higginbotham's furniture department! 
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