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Commissioners Meet Rising Star ISD Band Students 
Board Meeting Do Well in UIL 

Competition 

Progress Is— 

Making 

Good Things Happen 

Rabid Animal Here  

Pet Vaccination 
Clinic Saturday 

possibility of rabid ani-
mats in this area. The Rev. 
Darrell Dossey was re-
cently bitten by a rabid 
skunk at his home and'is 
undergoing the series of 
shots. Pets outdoors are 
also targets for rabid ani-
mals. Dr. Patrick suggests 
that every precaution be 
taken to protectyour pets, 
and yourselves, from ra-
bies. 

Dr. Virgil Patrick, a 
veterinarian from Cisco, 
will be at the Rising Star 
fire station on Saturday, 
February 29, from 2 until 
4:30 p.m. to vaccinate pets 
against rabies. 

He will donate $1.00 
from each vaccination 
given to the local fire 
department. 

A large wild animal 
population increases the 

Few File Locally 

Three Rising Star band 
students recently partici-
pated in U.I.L. solo and 
ensemble contest at Tar-
leton State University and 
received high honors. 
Laura Rankin played a 
class one flute solo and 
received a division II 
(excellent) rating. Emily 
Stuteville played a class 
one flute solo and received 

Randy Goldston and Dr. 
Charles Barnes. No one 
had filed for places on the 
ballot Tuesday. 

The joint election will 
be held Saturday, May 2. 
Deadline to file for aplica-
tion for places on the bal-
lots is March 18 at 5 p.m. 
Applications are available 
at City Hall and at the 
school office at 118 N. 
Main. 

The terms of two school 
board trustees expire this 
year, the terms of Tony 
Long and the late Wanda 
Hughes. As of Tuesday, 
Herb Collins and Billy 
Bush had filed for appli-
cations for places on the 
Rising Star Independent 
School District's ballot. 

The terms of three 
members of the Rising 
Star City Council expire; 
they are Billy Harmon, 

Emily Stuteville 	Laura Rankin 
Not pictured, Heather Wright 

a I (superior) rating. 
Heather Wright played a 
class two snare drum solo 
and received a division I 
(superior) rating. 

Emily was certified to 
go on to state and play her 
solo at Austin in June. 

Congratulations to 
these dedicated Rising 
Star High School band 
members on a job well 
done. 

Texas Public School Week March 2-6 

the computer. 
County Judge Bailey 

said that some of the 
house addresses are cor-
rect, but the town was 
wrong. 

Then there were the 

matters of road number-
ing and addressing of 
rural dwellings, which the 
Commissioners said was 
incomplete. 

To add to the confusion, 
State Highway numbers 
have recently been 
changed in some of the 
County, causing new 
addresses to be needed. 

Robinson reported that 
4,000 cards had recently 
been mailed from the 
Commissioners Court, 
listingnew addresses that 
would eventually become 
mailing addresses as well 
as 9-1-1 addresses. 

Of this number, Secre-
tary Jean White reported 
that 91 cards had been 
returned as undeliver-
able. 

Robinson said that also 
the Postal Service had 
mailed out a number of 
cards to people in various 
Precincts, listing new 
addresses. 

Robinson said his name 
and phone number were 
also printed on the cards, 
and he received about 400-
500 calls, with people 
wanting to know what was 
going on! Other Commis-
sioners also reported some 
anger and confusion over 
the cards. 

The Commissioner said 
the public is advised to 
continue to use regular 
mailing addresses until 
notification of change 
appears in newpapers and 
radio at some future date. 

The 9-1-1 System is not 
in operation yet, and it is 
going to take some time to 
iron out problems. 

On other matters, the 
Commissioners decided to 
hold a public hearing on 
the County's parking or-
dinance (around the 
Courthouse) before begin-
ning to enforce it. The 
Hearing will be at 2:00 
p.m. Monday, March 
2,1992. 

Commissioner Reggie 
Pittman reported good 
news that the jail popula- 

Star Pride Workers 
in Downtown Area Open House at 

Elementary Will 
Be Held Tuesday 

There was another 
group of workers who 
washed the windows of 
the Higginbotham Build-
ing. These were Jennifer 
Bronson and other mem-
bers of the high school 
resource class and the 
high school cheerleaders, 
Jo Linney, Athina Black, 
Inga Williams, Heather 
Wright, Arla Hill and 
Anna Ezzell. Thanks, 
everyone, for a job well 
done! 

Star Pride members and 
volunteershave been busy 
working around the down-
town area for the past two 
weeks. These workers 
include the following: 
Helen Donham, Cora 
Harrell, Darrell Dossey, 
Craig Scoville, Monte 
Jones, Kay O'Connor, 
David O'Connor, Tody 
Baker, Tonya Killion, 

Gene Moore and James 
Ramsey. Thanks to each 
of these workers from Star 
Pride. 

Texas Public School 
Week is scheduled for 
March 2-6. Special activi-
ties and excitement are 
planned to celebrate this 
week at Rising Star Ele-
mentary. 

Elementary students 
have been studying about 
ecology and ways to help 
our planet. Activities have 
included a can drive and a 
trash sculpture. Monies 
raised from the can drive 
will be used to help land-
scape the elementary 
campus. Trash sculptures 
are to be made by each 
grade level and will be 
displayed for open house. 
Parents, friends, and 
community members may 

Students Will 
Parade Tuesday 

vote for their favorite 
trash sculpture for $0.25 
a vote. All monies from 
this project will also be 
used to help landscape the 
elementary. 

Make plans now to visit 
your elementary during 
open house on Tuesday, 
March 3 from 7 until 8:30 
p.m. Open house will 
begin with a short pro-
gram in the cafeteria then 
parents and friends may 
visit their students class-
rooms. 

You are also invited to 
join the elementary school 
for lunch. Please check the 
school menu and plan for 
a special day to enjoy 
lunch with your child. 

The students will hear 
speakers from the high 
school Gifted/Talented 
Program. 

Rising Star Elementary 
School students will hold 
a patriotic parade down-
town at 1:30 p.m. Tues-
day, March 3. 

tion had fallen to 12. Two 
of these are scheduled for 
TDC, seven are awaiting 
trial, one is being held on 
a bench warrant and two 
on blue warrants. 

Eastland County Com-
missioners Monday re-
ported on damage to rural 
roads and bridges caused 
by floods during the last 
two months. Even as they 
talked to a cold rain was 
pouringoutside the Court-
room, adding to difficul-
ties they faced. 

Eastland County has 
a  been declared a disaster up area, and application has 

been made for funds to 
make repairs. But all the 
Commissioners reported 
no assistance as yet. 

Judge Scott Bailey said 
that "Individual Precinct 
budgets are going to be 
stretched" if the County 
has to pay for all these 
repairs. 

Pct. 1 Commissioner, 
Richard Robinson said he 
had carried government 
officials to view three sites 
that need repair. 

"Two of these are half-
way passable," he said. 

The other place has 
water running down the 
center ofthe road for about 
a thousand feet," Robin-
son added. 

The other Commission-
ers also reported trouble 
spots, Pct. 2 Commis-
sioner Ainsworth reported 
,27; Pet. 3 Commissioner 
Owen ,19; and Pct. 4 
Commissioner Pittman 
,28. 

Pittman said there were 
a number of places he still 
couldn't get in to look at. 
He said he still had roads 
that were under the wa-
ter the whole time. 

He suggested that 
people should write to the 
President and try to get 
more help. 

All the Commissioners 
said they had some tem-
porary repairs so traffic 
could get through. But all 
reported they did not have 
the money to do the type 
of rebuilding the roads 
needed. 

Attention turned to dif-
ficulties on the installa-
tion of the 9-1-1 Emer- 
gency Medical System in 
the County. 

A caller's name is sup-
posed to appear on a 
computer screen in the 
County Dispatch when 9-
1-1 is dialed. 

"Nearly every rural 
address on the computer 
is wrong," Commissioner 
Robinson said. 

The telephone Com-
pany was reported to have 
put that information into 

[Community Calendar City Election 
Calendar Dates LAST THURSDAY 

American Legion. 7:00 

Crime Of The Week Feb. 17-March 18 
Dates to apply to file 

applecation for a place on 

contract of Mohundro for 
one year through the 
1992-93 school year as 
elementary principal car-
ried 6-0. 

Due to previous board 
action two-year contracts 
are awarded to superin-
tendents only. Because of 
the current two-year con-
tracts that the principal 
and athletic directorhave, 
a renewal of contract is 
not necessary, but the 
board wishes to express 
support for Stuteville and 
Goodman for the 1992-93 
school year. 

The board unanimously 
accepted the resignation 
of Bryan as superinten-
dent of the school system 
effective at the end of the 
1991-92 school year. 

Board president Harris 
opened the three bids 
submitted on the repair-
ing the roof of the junior 
high building. They were: 
Smith Roofing, gravel roof 
$9,248.00, alternate 
$6,493.00; Barr Roofing, 
reroof $8,097.00, alter-
nate $6,984.00; and Larry 
Wilson, pitched metal 
roof, $18,000.00. 

The motion by Long, 
seconded by Wilson to 
accept the bid from Barr 
Roofing for reroofing the 
junior high buildingin the 
amount of $8,097.00 car-
ried 6-0. 

A motion by Chambers, 
seconded by Harris, to 
lease an automobile from 
Pullen Motors at $8.00 per 
day plus $.10 pr mile after 
the first 6,000 milses car-
ried 6-0. 

A motion by Chambers, 
seconded by Harris, to 
charge $160.00 per stu-
dent for drivers education 
trainging carried 6o-0. 

A motion by Harris, 
seconded by Agnew, to 
enter into a TASB Par-
ticipation agreement for 
a term of Feb. 8, 1992 to 
Feb. 8, 1993 and an Inter-
local Agreement for the 
same period of time car-
ried 6-o0. 

A motion by Wolf, sec-
onded by Wilson, to ap-
point Faye Medley as 
judge and Kathy Herring 
as early voting clerk for 
the election of two board 
members to three-year 
terms in a joint election 
with the City of Rising 
Star Saturday, May 2, 
1992 carried 6-0. They 
adopted a resolution for a 
run-off election to be held 
no later than 30 days af-
ter May 2 should it be-
come necessary. 

Meeting adjourned at 
1:31 a.m. 

EACH THURSDAY 
Senior Citizens Center is 
open for lunch, activities. 

1ST MONDAY 
Eastern Star 

EACH MONDAY , 
Boy Scouts, Activity 
Bldg., First Baptist, 6:30 

mimeos. WWWWWWWW 

1ST TUESDAY 
$tar Pride, Peoples State 
Bank, 5 p.m. 

Free AARP tax service for 
elderly and low income 
persons on Thursdays at 
Senior Citizens Center. 
Call the center, 643-5141, 
for appointment. 

Rising Str Junior 
High/High School 
Honor Students 

$1,000.00 for information 
leading to the arrest and 
indictment of person or 
persons responsible for 
this or any other felony 
crimes in Eastland 
County. To report on this 
or other crimes call: 

1-800-252-TIPS City Library, open Thurs-
days, 9:30-11 a.m. 

1ST WEDNESDAY 
Saturday Club,. City Li-
brary, 2 

ell.11•1••• WWWWWWWW 

School Calendar 
by Inn Williams 

FEBRUARY 23,1992 
The Eastland County 

Crime Stopper's Crime of 
the Week is that of a theft 
from a business in Ranger. 

The Ranger Police De-
partment is investigating 
the offense that occured 
at R & R Fuel sometime 
during the night of Sun-
day, February 9,1992. 
Person or persons un-
known removed several 
55 gallon oil drums and 
over 500 gallons of diesel 
fuel. The value of the theft 
is $522.90 

Eastland County Crime 
Stoppers will pay up to 

4Th FRIDAY 
Country/Western Musi-
cal..  American Legion 
Hall, S. Main, 6:30 

the ballot. 
March 3-April 24 

Dates to accept applica-
tion for early voting bal-
lots to be voted by mail. 

March 18 
Early voting clerk may 

begin mailing early vot-
ing ballots to applicants 
as soon as ballots are 
available on or after this 
date. 

March 27 
Last day for a candi-

date to withdraw. 
April 2 

Last day a person may 
register to vote in the May 
2 election. 

April 13-28 
Dates for early voting 

by personal appearance. 

..•••• ........ 

The Rising Star Inde-
pendent School District 
Board of Trustees met 
Feburary 10 at 7 p.m. in 
the board room. Present 
were David Harris, Tony 
Long, Larry Chambers, 
Gary Wilson, Frances 
Agnew and Dale Wolf. 

School personnel pres-
ent were Dr. Donald E. 
Bryan, Robby Stuteville, 
Randy Mohundro, Dan 
Goodman, Gene Smith, 
Penni Mohundro, Linda 
Webb, Kathy Bush, Shelly 
Bailey, Pam Cook, Sue 
Janes and Cindy Wood. 

Others present were 
Debbie White, Judi But-
ler, Michael Butler, Nan-
ette Goldston, Mackey 
Elliott, Stella Ware and 
Billy Bush. 

The minutes of the 
January 13 meeting were 
accepted as read. 

Tony Long arrived at 
7:10 p.m. 

Dr. Bryan presented the 
Academic Excellence In-
dicator Systerm Report 
for the 1990-91 school year 
and it was discussed. 

Stuteville reported 115 
students at the high 
school level. Academic 
events are being sched-
uled for spring activities. 
TENET is now in use at 
the high school. 

Mohundro reported 112 
students enrolled at ele-
mentary. Open house will 
be March 3 and the theme 
will be "Ecology." Elemen-
tary did not receive the 
PSI program. 

The Lunch and Break-
fast Program for January 
was presented by Mohun-
dro. 

Webb presented infor-
mation on Vocational 
Home Economiss courses; 
she presented statistics, 
course offerings and com-
mon essential elements. 

Smith presented infor-
mation on agriculture 
science and technology 
courses; he presented 
course offerings and in-
formation on sample 
courses. This was dis-
cussed. 

Bryan presented the 
Industrial Technology 
courses offered. 

He also duiscussed the 
County Education Dis-
tricts that were in a law-
suit. He said that Mohun-
dro was apppointed to the 
State Committee for 
TAAS Test in grade 9 
social studies. He reported 
receipt of $ 100 from KTXS 
Channel 12 for participat-
ing in the Quiz Bowl. 

Dr. Bryan presented the 
balance sheet for cash in 
bank, a list of all checks 
written for January and a 
comparison of revenue 
and expenditures to 
budget. The motion to pay 
the January bills pre-
sented carried 4-2; Cham-
bers and Wilson opposed 
because of the city gas bill 
when the meter was not 
working. 

The board entered ex-
ecutive session at 9 p.m. 
to discuss-personnel and 
returned to regular ses-
sion at 12:40 a.m. A mo-
tion by Agnew, seconded 
by Wilson, to extend the 

or 
629-8477 

Remember, you do not 
have to give your name to 
make a report to Crime 
Stoppers. You will remain 
anonymous. 

This crime of the week 
is good until: February 
29,1992. 

A 7th: None. 8th: Tianay 
Chambers. 9th: Brandi 
Harris and Misti Bailey 
10th: Christy Hughes and 
Emily Stuteville. 11th: 
None 12th: Brandon Geye. 

A/B 7th: None. 8th: Amy 
Collins, Angelia Delong, 
Samantha Kerr. 9th: 
Chris Bailey, Adela 

Tues., Mar. 3 
Miss Rising Star Tryouts, 
6 p.m . 

Sat., Mar. 7 
HS Track Meet at Baird 

EACH SATURDAY 
Dingo. American Legion 
Hall, S. Main 

Chavez, Heather Hutch-
inson, Chris Harrelson, 
and Olivia West. 10th: 
David Fisher, Tina Pat-
terson, Athena Black, 
Chris DeLong 11th: Laura 
Rankin. 12th: Matt Har-
mon, Chad Hill, Donnie 
Horton, Betty Jones, 
Gherda Williams 
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WE ARE THE FASTEST 
Others brag--we deliver. 

• We print cashiers checks 
on the premises. 
• No cash needed. 

• We've been taking care of 
your tax returns for years. 

• We have the know-how and close 
association with IRS: 

9,000 H&R Block offices with 
the largest tax staff in the world. 

H&R BLOCK 
THE ORIGINAL TAX OFFICE 

South Side of the Square 
Eastland 629-8121 8-6, M-F; 8-4, Sat. 4-11' 

Why wait for 
your federal 

income tax refund? 

	• 

,FARM 
BUREAU 

INSURANCE 

"Why Farm Bureau 
life insurance?" 

"Value. Their rates are 

competitive and help you get 

great value for your money. 

Your' agent can help you plan 

for the future with a wide ranee 

of products. Life Insurance. 

Annuities. IRA's, Mortgage 

Cancellation. Disability 

Income, Whole Life ... you 

name it. No wonder Americans 

from every walk of life depend 

on Farm Bureau Insurance." 

Helping You Is What 
We Do Best. 

Frank Agnew 
817/643-1010 
817/629-1704 

Southern Farm Burtau U4e Insurance Company 
Jackson, Mississippi 

a 
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from Janet Thomas 	County Extension Agent 
Extension Homeakers 

Everyone enjoyed the 
beautiful weather at our 
center Thursday. We had 
a lovely birthday lunch 
honoring Amy Davis, 
Theo Boyd, Joe Ward, 
Edith Bostick and Irma 
Lee Jones. 

Dell Bible baked the 
lovely birthday cake. 
Thank you so much for 
doing this for our center. 
We appreciate it so much. 

Marion and Marjorie 
West have started their 
garden. They planted 
potatoes, onions, corn and 
put out some cabbage 
which they put hot caps 
over. 

We were sorry that 
Casey Pittman passed 
away suddenly. Our 
heartfelt sympathy goes 
out to his family and 
friends. 

Marion and Marjorie 
West attended a covered 
dish dinner and enjoyed 
the program at Cisco 
AARP meetingThursday. 

Some lovely travel 
tapes are being shown at 
the activity building at 
the Church of Christ. 
They are being shown at 
2:30 p.m. each Tuesday. 
The next film will be 
shown March 3 at 2:30 
p.m. A number of lovely 
places have been shown, 
including the Eastern 

The meeting was opened 
by Winnie Armstrong 
with the Lord's prayer in 
unison. 

Old business was taken 
care of and cards sent to 
the ill. 
Song, "My Faith Looks 

Up to Thee". 
The program was on 

by Marjorie West 
United Stated and the 
Grand Canyon. Everyone 
is invited. Coffee and 
cookies are served at each 
meeting. 

Berna Lee Chick visited 
the May Senior Citizen 
Center on Wednesday as 
a guest of Odell Cham-
bers. The center has been 
done over completely and 
surely is nice and such a 
nice bunch of people. 

We really appreciate 
our flower shop. Monty 
Jones, owner of the shop, 
brought a lovely flower 
arrangement for our 
birthday luncheon. It was 
just beautiful. We really 
appreciate Monty and 
Jewel for these flowers. 
They really add to our 
birthday celebrations. 

Joyce Geye has a new 
granddaughter. Terry and 
Gretchin Geye have a 
baby girl, born Februrary 
18. Congratulations to the 
new parents. 

Our Eastland County 
Sheriff, Ronnie White, 
and Tex Evans were our 
visitors Thursday. We are 
glad you came and come 
anytime you can. 

The bank employees 
that come regularly were 
our guests, also Betty and 
Garry Duggan were visi-
tors at the center Thurs-
day. Please come again. 

faith led by Deariso Duen- 
sing. The scripture was 
Hebrews, Chapterl2, 
verses 1 and 2 . 

Those present were Win-
nie Anderson, Mamie 
Joyce, Deariso Duensing, 
Winnie Armstrong and 
Maurine Wells. 

The Quilting Club 
worked on the Butterfly 
Applique and the Dutch 
Puzzle on Tuesday. 

An inch and a half of 
rain fell on the commu-
nity Monday morningand 
it.was still raining as this 
column was taken to the 
newspaper office. 

Frankie and Oliver 
Smith and Jean Fore went 
to Ranger Saturday as 
usual. Saturday night 
they enjoyed the Echo 
Musical. Frankie and 
Oliver visited his sister, 
Mrs. Elva Olive, and sis-
ter-in-law, Mrs. Fred 
Smith, in Brownwood 
Sunday afternoon. 

Visitors at the home of 

Our theme for this 
meeting was "American-
ism," which should be very 
close to our hearts and 
minds, being election 
year, so we can exercise 
our rights as Americans 
to put into action what we 
believe. 

Guest speaker was Mrs. 
Richard (Connie) Watson 
from Gorman. Her review 
of the American 
constitution and , the 
struggle our forefathers 
had to put it all together. 
Inspired by God's will and 
the Christian Bible, our 
laws were formed not for 
just the people at thattime 

Meeting closed with 
U.M.W. prayer. 

Winnie Anderson servea 
coffee and cookies. 

The Tuesday game 
night was well attended 
and enjoyed by all. 

Mrs. Pat Leslie spent 
the week with her sister, 
Mrs. Vicky Crow, at Hico 
who is ill. 

Mrs. Kenita Ranier is 
home after visiting with 
her daughter and family 
in Montana. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dee Brown 
of Marble Falls visited his 
sister, Opal Whiteside, 
also,Joyce McKeehan and 
Mary Jo Dickey of 
DeLeon. 

Mrs. Jack Millwee vis-
ited her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Layne Cotter, at 
Pioneer one day last week. 

Mrs. Conova Weaver 
visited her sister-in-law, 
Mrs. Loman Cagle, who is 
ill at Comanche. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Bar-
ton visited their son, J.E. 
Barton and wife, at Dub-
lin last Saturday. 

Relatives and friends 
received the death mes-
sage of Cyril Jones of 
Tuscola. He passed away 
at Abilene Friday. He was 
the brother of Duby Jones  

by Irma Miller 

James and Jean Alexan-
der Saturday aften000n 
were Jo and Wallace Cul-
lars of Breckenridge. 

Novilia Barton's visitors 
last week were Nell Flem-
ing, who brought Novilia 
some of her birthday cake, 
and Cecil and Mary Bar-
ton of Waco. 

Laverne Hutton accom-
panied by mother, Mrs. 
Ella Dean ofCross Plains, 
was in Abilene Monday 
on business. 

Visitors with John and 
Irma Miller Saturday 
evening were her brother 
and wife, Dean and Carol 
Brannan of Coleman, and 
Peggy Denman, also of 
Coleman. 

but for generations to 
come. Let's all strive to 
keep it that way by keep-
ing ourselves educated on 
what is going on in our 
government and what we 
can do to keep it from 
ultimate destruction. God 
knows when a sparrow 
falls, doesn'the even know 
when a nation rises? As 
world events unfold na-
tions are falling, let us not 
be next. 

OUr hostesses for this 
meeting were Connie 
Hightower, Edra Butler, 
and Pearl Anderson. 
Thank you ladies for a 
wonderful program and 
the lovely and delicious 
luncheon. 

Our next meeting will 
be March 4. See you then. 

of Rising Star. We extend 
our sympathy to his fam-
ily and all relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Nonnie 
Leonard Jr., Ronnie Le-
onard of Rising Star and 
Gayle Leonard- of Fort 
Worth were visitors of 
Mae Leonard last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Barton of Archer City and 
Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Barton 
of Dublin were visitors of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Barton 
this past week. 

Happy Birthday 

FEBRUARY 28 
Ozzie Burns, Gary Jones, 
Chris Inglet 

FEBRUARY 29 
Gary Hubbard 

MARCH 1 
Tony Long, Billy Harmon, 
Holly Butler, Jim Hook 

MARCH 2 
Douglas Walker, Christi 
Clark, Ray Burcham 

MARCH 3 
Mike Fraley, Lynda Ford, 
Ludene Michael, Faye 
Brush, Dona Killion, 
Jesse Hurst, Mikel Car-
ter 

MARCH 4 
Lillie Alford, Annie Ruth 
Christian, Paul Fullerton, 
Jean Wilson, Jane Fuller-
ton, Jetta Darr, Tim 
Evans 

MARCH 5 
Bill Carpenter, Delbert 
Green, Richard Pennell  

The Rising Star I 
Sens 
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L & J  
Construction 

Lynn Hutton 
725-7582 

Or 

Jim Ratliff 
643-6464 

Callfor estimate on any 
construction jobs. 

aLYERILIE 
Lox TNTEir DRUGS  
The Extension Home-

maker Club leader train-
ing program will be "Over 
the Counter Drugs." 
The program will be Tues-
day, February 25th at 
10:00 a.m. in the Eastland 
T.U. Reddy Room. Guest 
speaker will be Dale 
Squires, local pharmacist 
and owner of Eastland 
Drug. Being an informed 
consumer is most impor- 
tant. The meeting is open 
to the public. Free educa-
tional handouts will be 
available. This program 
is being sponsored by the 
Eastland County Exten-
sion Service. 

* * * 

127 Eastland County 
residents have pre-regis-
tered and made a com-
mitment to attend the 
"Positive Action For 
Youth" Conference which 
will be held at the 
Eastland High School on 
February 28th and 29th. 

The Conference has 
been planned and isbeing 
sponsored by the Eastland 
Positive Action for Youth 
Coalition, and Region 14 
Education Service Center 
of Abilene. 

The Conference is 
FREE, and child care is 
being made available 
FREE to the Conference 

An Eastland County 
steering committee for the 
Bill Clinton for President 
Campaign is being 
formed. His campaign is 
active in Eastland  

participants. 
The Student Councils 

from Ranger, Eastland 
and Cisco will be assist-
ing with refreshment 
breaks during the Con-
ference. The F.H.A. Chap-
ters are providing cook-
ies, and Thrift Mart is 
sponsoring a free lunch 
on Saturday. The Exten-
sion Homemaker Club 
ladies are baking cakes 
for dessert. 

RECIK FOR 
Tom' WEEK 

Sugarless  Fruitbars  
1 cup raisins 
1 t. baking powder 
1 cup chopped dates 

1 t. cinnamon 
1 cup chopped prunes 
1 egg or egg substitute 
1 cup flour 
1 stick butter 
1-1/2 cup water 

Coconut or chopped nuts 
(optional) 

First, put raisins, dates 
and prunes thathave been 
chopped, into the water 
and boil together. Stir 
while mixing. After boil-
ing, add butter, flour, 
baking powder, and cin-
namon. Stir completely. 
Spray a 9x13x2" pan with 
Pam and pour all of mix-
ture into pan. Bake at 350 
degrees for 20-25 minutes. 
Let cool before cuttingand 
serving. 

County, according to June 
Hicks, county coordinator 
for Clinton. Anyone inter-
ested in the Clinton cam-
paign has been asked to 
leave a recorded message 
at (817) 442-2866. 

Obituaries 
Gwendolyn Collier Singer 

BRYAN - Funeral services for Gwendolyn Collier 
Singer, 50, of Bryan were held Wed., Feb. 19, 1992 at 
Hillier Funeral Chapel at Bryan with the Rev. Ben-
jamin Aurand of St. Thomas Episcopal Church in Col-
lege Station officiating, assisted by the Rev. BobRichers 
of First United Methodist Church in Bryan. Burial was 
in Oakland Cemetery at Navasota. 
Mrs. Singer died Feb. 17 at her home, following a 

lengthy illness. 
She was assistant director of purchases at Texas A&M 

University, and in Decembr received the President's 
Meritorious Award for service to the university. 
Survivors include a son, David Steel of Dallas, a 

daughter, Carla Singer of Bryan; her mother, Mary 
E. Collier of Bryan; two brothers, Robert Collier of Hous-
ton and John Collier of Los Angeles, Calif.; and a sister, 
Ann Collier Jacks of Dallas. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Steel of Rising Star, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Power of Comanche, Mrs. Vance Boyd of Anson 
and James Steel of Dallas attended the services. 

Thomas Parker Metcalf 
SEAGRAVES - Thomas Parker Metcalf, 87, died 

Thurs., Feb. 20, 1992, at a Brownfield hospital. Services 
were at 10 a.m. Saturday at Connally Funeral Home 
Chapel with the Rev. Gene Tone officiating. Graveside 
services were at 2 p.m. Sunday with the Rev. Darrell Allk 
Dossey officiating at Blake Cemetery near Rising Star. W 
Mr. Metcalf was born in Rising Star and moved to 

Seagraves in 1955. He was a member of First Baptist 
Church. 

He was the widower of Mattie Valera. 
Survivors include a son, Bill Metcalf of Seminole; two 

daughters, Gladys Middleton of Robert Lee and Mary 
Palmer of Seagraves; 10 grandchildren; and 17 great-
grandchildren. 

Jim Cyril Jones 
Tuscola - Jim Cyril Jones, 97, died Fri., Feb. 21, 1992 

at an Abilene nursing home. Services were at 2:30 p.m. 
Sunday at First United Mtehodist Church with the 
Revs. James Martin and T.C. Melton officiating. Burial 
was in Rogers Cemetery, directed by Fry-Bartlett 
Funeral Home. 
Mr. Jones was born in Hamilton County and moved to 

Tuscola in 1904, where he had lived ever since. He was 
a farmer, stock farmer and a Baptist. 
Survivors include two daughters, Frances L. Cumby 

and Anna Bell Horton, both of Tuscola; a brother, A.B. 
"Duby" Jones of Rising Star; a sister, Farriel Jones of 
Houston; nine grandchildren; 25 great-grandchildren; 
and 15 great-great-grandchildren. 

Eunice Lasater 
EASTLAND - Eunice Lasater, 89, died Sat., Feb. 22, 

199, in an Abilene hospital. Services were at 2 p.m. 
Monday at Bethel Baptist Church with the Rev. Dewey 
Lamb officiating. Burial was in Eastland Cemetery, 
directed by Edwards Funeral Home. 

Born in Carbon, Mrs. Lasater attended school in Long 
Branch. She owned and operated Eastland Steam 
Laundry with her husband until 1968 and was a member 
of Bethel Baptist Church. 

She was the widow of Bruce W. Lasater. 
Survivors include a daughter, Claudine Faith Boggs of 

Abilene; three sons, Doyle Lasater of Rising Star, Bill 
Lasater of Breckenridge and Max Lasater of Plano; a 
brother, Jack Black of Brady; four sisters, Willie Hines, 
Duluth Jackson, Arduth Been and Meredith Baze, all of 
Eastland; four grandchildren; and 10 great-grandchil-
dren. 

Senior Citizens Center Pioneer Patchwork 

United Methodist Women 

GFWC Saturday Club 

Sipe Springs News 

Campaign for 
Clinton Forming 

Church Directory 
WORSHIP IN THE CHURCH OF YOUR CHOICE THIS SUNDAY 

Pioneer Baptist Church 	Calvary Bapti.:t 	Calvary Assembly Church 
May 400 S. Miller 

Union Center 	 Sipe Springs 	 First Baptist Church 
Baptist Church 	 Church 	 400 N Main 

Assembly of Yahweh 	Church of Christ 	Bible Baptist Church 
(7th Day) 	 204 W College 	 300 W College 

United Methodist Church 300 W. College 

Higginbotham 
Funeral Home 

506 N. Main 	643-4321 

Jim Ratliff 
Welding 

500 E. Mill 	643-6464 

Palace Drug 
Store 

Professional Prescription Service 

101 N. Main 	643-3231 

Twin Drilling 
& Well Service 

John G. Lee, Owner 
205 N. Main 	643-7101 

Peoples State Bank 
Member FDIC 

214 W. College 643-2811 

Support Our 
Local Merchants 

Rising Star 
Flower Shop 

N.  Main St. 	643-2023 

The Rising Star 
Your Hometown Newspaper 

104 N. Main 	643-4141 

Medley 
Motor Co. 

Quality Workmanship 
110 W. College 	643-6211 

Chamber 
of Commerce 

Helping Your Town Grow 
643-1209 

'the Ole Store 
119 N. Main 	643-2221 
Nancy & Robert Bostick, Owners 

L & J Construction 
Lynn Hutton 	Jim Ratliff 
725-7582 	643-6464 



ELIZABETH KOENIG, 

643-6251 E. Hiway 36 

643-4141 105 N. Main 

Pioneer Farmers 
Cooperative 

Pioneer 	725-6564 

Frank Agnew, Agent 
Farm Bureau 

104 N. Main Rising Star 643-1010 
817/629-1704 Eastland 

Winfrey 
Feed & Peanut 

Peoples State of Clyde 
Rising Star Branch 

Member FDIC 

206 W. College 	643-2811 

Lynn Hutton 
725-7583 	643-6464 

L&J Construction 

Jim Ratliff 

Chamber of 
Commerce 

110 N. Main 	643-1209 

The Rising Star 
Your Hometown Newspaper 

430 E. Mill 	643-6464 

Higginbotham 
Funeral Home 

Gene and Reba Lynn 
643-4321 

Jim Ratliff 
Welding 

The Rising Star 

Eastland County Livestock Show Winners 
Thursday, February 27, 1992 

Photo Courtesy Of 
Express Photos 

I 

SHANE CARAWAY TODD CANTWELL 

ILO ill I I 

ASHLEY LAMINACK 

Continued 
DAIRY COWS 

Grand Champion- 
Donald Majors; Reserve 
Grand 	Champion- 

Stephen Reich; Show-
manship-Stephen Reich. 

Holstein 
6-11 Months 

1. Stephen Reich, Cisco 
4-H; 2. Kimberly Reich, 
Cisco 4-H; 3. Donald 
Majors, Gorman FFA. 

Holstein 
Over 1 Year 

1. Donald Majors, Gor-
man FFA; 2. Donna Ma-
jors, Gorman FFA; 3. 
Kenneth Fuquay, Nimrod 
4-H. 

BREEDING BEEF 
Limousin 

6-11 months 
1. Garrett Gerhardt, 

Cisco. 
Limousin 

18-23 months 
1. Kerstin Gerhardt, 

'6M 

Cisco; 2. Grayson Ger-
hardt, Cisco. 

Simmental 
6-11 months 

1. Kristi Wright, 
Eastland. 

Simmental 
12-17 months 

1. Ashley French, 
Eastland. 

Crossbred 
6-11 months 

1. Jason Stroebel, Nim-
rod 4-H; 2. Jan ecka Stroe-
bel, Cisco FFA; 3. Bonnie 
Crozier, Nimrod 4-H. 

Crossbred 
12-17 months 

1. April Fuquay, Nim-
rod 4-H. 

Champion Limousin-
Kerstin Gerhardt; Re-
serve Champion Li-
mousin-Garrett Ger-
hardt. 

Champion Simmental-
Kristi Wright; Reserve 
Champion Simmental- 

Ashley French. 
Champion Crossbred-

Jason Stroebel; Reserve 
Champion-Janecka 
Stroebel. 

Grand Champion Beef-
ing Heifer-Kerstin Ger-
hardt; Reserve Cham-
pion-Garrett Gerhardt. 

Showmanship-Kristi 
Wright. 

BREEDING SHEEP 
Ewe Lamb/ 
Fine Wool 

1. Trisha Hutchins, 
Cisco 4-H; 2. Trisha 
Hutchins, Cisco 4-H; 3. 
Tommy Thompson, Cisco 
FFA; 4. Tommy Th-
ompson, Cisco FFA. 

2 tooth Ewe/ 
Fine Wool 

1. Tommy Thompson, 
Cisco FFA; 2. Jackie 
Powledge, Cisco FFA. 

4 tooth Ewe/Aged 
Ewes/Fine Wool 

1. Trisha Hutchins, 
Cisco 4-H; 2. Tommy 
Thompson, Cisco FFA; 3. 
Tommy Thompson, Cisco 
FFA. 

Champion Ewe-Trisha  

Hutchins, Lamb; Re-
serve-TommyThompson, 
2 tooth Ram Lamb. 

4 tooth Ram/ 
Fine Wool 

1. Tommy Thompson, 
Cisco FFA; 2. Tim Th-
ompson, Cisco FFA; 3. 
Jackie Powledge, Cisco 
FFA. 

Champion Buck-
Tommy Thompson, 4 
tooth; Reserve Buck-Tim 
Thompsoi., 4 tooth. 

Ewe Lamb/ 
Medium Wool 

1. Tommy Thompson, 
Cisco FFA; 2. Ashley 
Laminack, Gorman FFA; 
3. Tommy Thompson, 
Cisco FFA. 

2 Tooth Ewe/ 
. 	Medium Wool 

1. Tommy Thompson, 
Cisco FFA; 2. Shane Car-
away, Gorman FFA. 

4 Tooth Ewe/ 
Medium Wool 

1. Tommy Seay, Olden 
4-H; 2. Tommy Th-
ompson, Cisco FFA; 3. 
Sam Curtis, Cisco FFA. 

Rain Lamb/ 

Medium Wool 
1. Tommy Thompson, 

Cisco FFA; 2. Shane Car-
away, Gorman FFA; 3. 
Jamie Agnew, Nimrod 4-
H. 

4 Tooth Ram/ 

Medium Wool 
1. Tim Thompson, Cisco 

FFA. 
Champion Medium 

Wool Ewe-Tommy Seay; 
Reserve-Tommy Th-
ompson. 

Champion Medium 
Buck-Tommy Thompson; 
Reserve-Tim Thompson. 

Southdown 
Ewe Lamb 

1. Becky Agnew, Nim-
rod 4-H; 2. Jamie Agnew, 
Nimrod 4-H; 3. Bobby 
Simmons, Cisco FFA. 

Southdown 
2 Tooth Ewe 

1. Tommy Thompson, 
Cisco FFA; 2. Tim Th-
ompson, Cisco FFA; 3. 
Tim Thompson, Cisco 
FFA. 

Southdown 
Aged Ewes 

Sam Curtis, Cisco FFA; 

Tommy Thompson, Cisco 
FFA. 

Southdown 
Rain Lamb 

1. Tommy Thompson, 
Cisco FFA; 2. Jamie 
Agnew, Nimrod 4-H; 3. 
Tim Thompson, Cisco 
FFA. 

BREEDING 
RABBITS 

White Junior Buck 
1. Kori Cooper, 

Eastland 4-H; 2. Kali 
Arther, Eastland 4-H; 3. 
Joanna Wallace, Ranger 
4-H. 

White Junior Doe 
1. Joanna Wallace, 

Ranger 4-H; 2. Elizabeth 
Koenig, Ranger 4-H; 3. 
Sommer Sharp, Ranger 
FFA. 

Colored Senior 
Buck 

1. Elizabeth Koenig, 
Ranger 4-H; 2. Elizabeth 
Koenig, Ranger 4-H; 3. 
Tracy Chaffin, Eastland 
FFA. 

White Senior Buck 
1. Joanna Wallace, 

Ranger 4-H; 2. Hannah  

Nicks, Cisco 4-H; 3. Billy 
Don Coxsey, Eastland 
FFA. 

Colored Senior Doe 
1. Tracy Chaffin, 

Eastlarid FFA; 2. Laney 
Thomas, Eastland FFA; 
3. Chad Cannistraci, 
Cisco FFA. 

White Senior Doe 
1. Michael Rabb, Nim-

rod 4-H; 2. Laney Tho-
mas, Eastland FFA; 3. 
Billy Don Coxsey, 
Eastland FFA. 

Colored 
Junior Buck 

1. Mirah Clark, Rising 
Star 4-H. 

Best of Show-Michael 
Rabb; Best Opposite-
Elizabeth Koenig; Show-
manship-Joanna Wal-
lace. 

Junior Doe 
Under 12 months 

1. Stephen Reich, Cisco 
4-H; 2. Karl Winge, Nim-
rod 4-H; 3. Telitha Winge, 
Nimrod 4-H. 

Senior Kids 
12 to 24 months 

1. Kimberly Reich, 
Cisco; 2. Telitha Winge, 
Nimrod; 3. Stephen Reich, 
Nimrod. 

Champion Kid-Kim-
berly Reich, Nimrod; 
Reserve Kid-Telitha 
Winge, Nimrod. 

Senior Doe All 
Other Breeds 

1. Kimberly Reich, 
Cisco; 2. Stephen Reich, 
Nimrod; 3. Karl Winge, 
Nimrod. 

Senior Doe Nubian 
1. Hannah Nicks; 2. 

Telitha Winge, Nimrod; 
3. Mirram Nicks. 

Champio% Senior Doe-
Hannah Nicks; Reserve 
Champion-Kimberly 
Reich, Showmanship-
Kimberly Reich. 

BREEDING SWINE 
Berkshire 

1. Samantha Stephens, 
Gorman FFA; 2. J. 
J.Clark, Gorman FFA; 3. 
John Mart Stephens, 
Gorman FFA. 

Chester White 
Class 2 

1. Jeremy Orsagh, 
- - 	_ 

Olden 4-H; 2. Lacey 
Knight, Rising Star FFA. 

Chester White 
Class 3 

1. Camille Pharr, Cisco 
FFA; 2. Ashley Laminack, 
Gorman FFA; 3. Donny 
Choate, Cisco FFA. 

Crossbred Class4 
1. Christina 	' 

&Tinian FFA; 2 Slitiley 
Crocker, Cisco FFA; 3. 
Tracie Crocker, Cisco 
FFA. 

Crossbred Class 5 
1. Reece Clark, Gor-

man, FFA; 2. Tommy 
Seay, Olden 4-H; 3. Shan-
non Mauney, Gorman 
FFA. 

Duroc 
1. Camille Pharr, Cisco 

FFA:,2. Chamille Pharr, 
Cisco FFA. 

Hampshire Class 10 
1. Shane Caraway, 

Gorman FFA; 2. Tommy 
Seay, Olden 4-H; 3. Jer-
emy Orsagh, Olden 4-H. 

Hampshire Class 11 
1. Jeremy Orsagh,. 

Olden 4-H. 
Hampshire Class 12: 
1. Tommy Seay, Olden, 

4-H; 2. Blake Guthrey, 
Gorman FFA. 

Hampshire Class 9 
1. Christina Mauney, 

Gorman FFA; 2. Don 
Mauney, Gorman FFA; 3. 
Becca Carlton, Eastland 
FFA. 

Spotted 13 
1. Jessica Keith, Olden 

4-H; 2. Amanda Cearley, 
Cisco 4-H. 

Spotted Class 14 
1. Ashley Rich, Gorman 

FFA; 2. Tracie Crocker, 
Cisco FFA; 3. Traci In- 
gram, Cisco FFA. 

Spotted Class 15 
1. Samantha Stephens, 

Gorman FFA. 
Spotted Class 16 

1. Tessi Ingram, Cisco 
FFA. 

Yorkshire Class 17 
1. Ty Hart, Olden 4-H. 
Yorkshire Class 18 

1. Jeremy Orsagh, 
Olden 4-H. 

Yorkshire Class 19 
1. Tommy Seay, Olden 

4-H. 
Grand Champion-Jer-

emy Orsagh, Hampshire, 
Olden 4-H; Reserve 
Grand Champion-Reese 
Clark. Cross, Gorman 
FFA; Show r ,an chip-John 
Man. --,tephens, arm 
FFA. 

In Support 
of Our Youth NottICHT Foe*  



SEATBELTS 
Buckle Up 

for Safety! 

1117 

J.C. and Katie Cook, owners of Cook's 
Fish Barn. The Cooks and their chil-
dren operate this family-type restau-
rant. They say they like to see people 
enjoy themselves. 

    

 

CHIROPRACTIC 
FOR BETTER HEALTH 

 

DR. STEPHEN G. BARRY 

  

  

CHIROPRACTOR-- 

   

MEDICAL RESEARCH SUPPORTS CHIROPRACTIC 

The British Medical Journal  
reports that Chiropractic treatment 
of low back pain, which affects 75 
million Americans, is superior to 
the standard regimen administered 
by medical doctors. 

The study, published in the 
summer of 1990, indicated that 
chiropractic manipulation can re-
lieve severe back pain quicker and 
at lower cost than medical treat-
ment. Chiropractic patients experi-
enced less pain and disability and 
missed fewer days work. 

At Barry Chiropractic Clinic we 
are committed to not only getting 

you free of back paid but treating 
those conditions which cause your 
pain. No symptom can be more 
depressing than persistent back pain. 
Don't delay treatment when help is 
readily available. 

In the.  interest of better health 
from the office of: 

Dr. Stephen G. Barry 
--Chiropractor-- 

951 E. Main, Eastland 
629-1771 

5-104 

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 

The Golden Hut 
Chinese Restaurant 

>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>>> 

Opened Up in Breckenridge. 
2910 W. Walker 559-2442 

Tuesday to Sunday  
Lunch 11 to 2:30 p.m. 

Dinner 4:30 to 9:00 p.m. 
Friday & Saturday night 

Open till 9:30 
All You Can Eat Lunch Buffet 

FREE Fried Won Ton for Everyone 

Lunch Buffet Tuesday - Sunday, 11 to 2 p.m. 

$3.99 	
5-21 
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GARRETT 
Photography Studio 

Children's Portraits 	Commercial 

 

Wedding 
	

Modeling 

Call for appointment 

1011 West 11th 
(817) 442-2285 Cisco, Texas 

5-22 
.41 

DOES YOUR 
BOAT DOCK 

a NEED A LIFT? 
k • 

a a 

We now have Styrofoam 
Flotation Barrels 

a 
	Available for just 

1* 

	

995  

Higginbotham-Bartlett Co. 
313 West Main, Eastland 

629-1311 

RANDY GATTli 
PLUMBING 

Residential & Commercial Repairs 
Remodeling & New Construction 

Electric Sewer & Sink Cleaning Machines 
Water Heaters & Plumbing Fixtures 

State Licensed - Master License - M-18038 

Free Estimates 
Call: 442-1688 24 lirs/day 

106 Ave. I Cisco, Texas 

s'• 

Cook's Fish Barn "Lots Of 
Work and Lots Of Fun" 

Six Flags Over Texas To Begin 
31st Season On February 29 

By Viola Payne 
It's a busy Sunday af-

ternoon at Cook's Fish 
Barn, located 12 miles 
southeast of Rising Star 
on Highway 36. 

Cars are parked out-
side the long, low build-
ing, built something like 
the deck of a ship. People 
are going up the ramp 
into the entrance, while 
inside the owners J.C. and 
Katie Cook and family 
members greet custom-
ers, seat them at rustic 
tables, and cook, serve and 
visit. 

The scene is colorful-
wide plank floors, fish 
nets hanging from the 
ceilings. And floating 
through the hum' of con-
versation is vintage coun-
try-western music, part of 

collection of tapes and 
'ecords owned by the 

Ciene Autry at the be-
ginning of his career, 
Marty Robbins with clas-
sic cowboy songs, the Sons 
of the Pioneers and Hank 
Williams at his best make 
a background for the 
family-reunion atmos-
phere. 

The music also fits with 
old cowboy prints and  

western decor on the 
walls-decorations which 
somehow blend with the 
nautical look. 

But people are concen-
trating on the food. The 
"All U can eat" specials 
feature Freshwater Cat-
fish and Southern Style 
Cod, chicken planks, or 
smaller versions of these 
plates. 

Ordinners have a choice 
of a meal from the ample 
salad bar, or a huge sea-
food plate, also shrimp, 
oysters, steak and vari-
ous side orders. 

The printed menu 
hardly doesjustice to what 
comes with the main 
dishes-savory hush pup-
pies, slaw and crisp fries. 
Servings are generous on 
everything. 

Several people order 
plates to take out, and 
another person mentions 
that Cook is equipped for 
real good catering for large 
groups anywhere in the 
area. Someone says that 
the restaurant is always 
doing community bene-
fits, stock shows, and for 
the Rising Star and Sipes 
Springs Fire Depart-
ments. 

Toward the Sunday  

closing time, 3:00 p.m., 
J.C. Cook gives the last of 
the customers a special 
treat. He carries his gui-
tar to the bandstand at 
one end of the big room 
and sings a few songs. 

This bandstand is a 
focal point-centered with 
a set of drums, the are lit 
by cylinders of lights in 
green and fushia. Some-
times Cook's band comes 
up fi-om Sidney to play 
here: Norman Chandler, 
Gary Clark, and Tommy 
Connaly. 

But today it's just Cook, 
joined soon by dark-haired 
daughter Connie Cook 
Howard and two year old 
grandson, Trevor How-
ard. Jeff' Howard, Connie's 
husband, carries the last 
ofthe trays to the kitchen. 

Their well-modulated 
voices blend. Little Tre-
vor decides to sing with 
his granddad, probably 
just as Cook had done with 
his family long ago. 

Raised righ there where 
the restaurant is located, 
J.C. Cook comes from a 
family where music is a 
way oflife. When he was a 
child his aunts, uncles and 
mother all sang and 
played with several 
bands. 

Today Cook winds up 
his music with "The Way 
I Am." He puts down his 
guitar and walks across 
to where his wife, Katie, 
is closing out the kitchen.  

The Fish Barn will open 
next Thursday and run 
from 4:30-10:00 p.m. 
Thursday-Saturday, and 
then be open 11:00 a.m.-
3:00 p.m. Sunday. 

"But it's actually a seven 
day per week job," Cook 
declares. He motions 
toward his attractive wife. 
"You're looking at the 
brains of this business 
right now. She is our CPA, 
secretary, cook, dish-
washer and in charge of 
personnel." 

"But this is actually a 
family business. Our 
daughter Connie and 
husband, Jeff Howard, 
another daughter Christy 
and husband, Dean Hol-
land-they all work hard 
here too. Our other daugh-
ter, Rebecca, and her 
husband Doug Caffey live 
in Abilene." 

The Cooks note that 
Connie, Jeffand Dean are 
honor students at Cisco 
Junior College, in addi-
tion to their work at the 
Fish Barn. 

"Another hard worker 
here is Marsha Dittrick, 
who helps the family out 
with whatever needs to 
be done," Katie Cook says. 

Cook remarks that he 
started the business here 
in 1984 with one little 
room. He worked at other 
things before- driving a 
truck, and running a big 
greenhouse on the family 
farm. 

MOBILE 1 
HOME 

TRANSPORTING 
Complete Moves 

& Setups 
Moving 

Throughout Texas 
• Tie Downs 
• Blocking 

& Leveling 

* Licensed 
* Bonded 
* Insured 

18 Years Experience 

817-893-6753 
5-104 

"People thought I was 
kind of crazy, trying to 
have a restaurant outhere 
so far from town," he 
remarks. 

But he had an idea that 
people would come a long 
way for good food and a 
chance to enjoy them-
selves. 

"We started with bar-
beque and worked with 
that for two years. We still 
fix it now and then-espe-
cially if someone wants it 
for a benefit." 

"But we found out we 
like working with fish the 

best, using a batter like 
Katie cooked at home." 

He says that the family, 
referring to himself and 
his sons-in-law, literally 
constructed the place as 
business expanded, add-
ing on a porch and finally 
the bigroom. Now the Fish 
Barn will seat around 250 
people, and serves 1200-
1500 people weekly. 

"It's lots of work, but a 
lot of fun!" Cook declares. 

One of the interesting 
things is how far people 
will drive to eat here. J.C. 
and Katie name over some 
of the places customers 
come from: Ranger, 
Eastland, Cisco, Dublin, 
Stephenville, Granbury, 
Abilene, Comanche, Cole-
man, Brownwood and of 
course many from Rising 
Star, De Leon, and Gor-
man. 

The Cooks remark that 
they were pretty easy-
going on most things-but 
on one subject they are 
really set in their ways. 

They say you have to be 
especially careful about 
fish products, and they 
won't serve anything that 
does not come from U.S. 

SPECIAL! 

DENTURES 
$395.00 Set**  

Price Good With This Ad 

Professional 
Denture Clinic 
Gary M. Easley, 

D.D.S. 
General Dentistry 

203 Valley Forge 
Comanche, TX 76442 

915-356-5263 
1-800-235-1732 

FREE 
CONSULTATIONS 

Lab On Premises 
Soft Lined Dentures 

Palateless Upper Dentures 
Repairs As You Wait 

SENIOR CITIZEN 
DISCOUNTS 

5 23 

**Prices may vary with addi-
tional or different materials, 
techniques used or individ-
ual needs of patient. 

Six Flags Over Texas 
will begin its 1992 season 
Saturday, Feb. 29. 

The huge theme park 
which opened in 1961, will 
welcome its 68 millionth 
guest this spring. Last 
season's attendance ex-
ceeded 2.6 million. 

The family entertain-
ment center will be open 
on weekends only during 
the spring months, with 
the exception of the pe-
riod from March 14 
through 22 when the park 
will be open daily for 
"Spring Break Out,"a new 
special event for students 
on Spring Break. 

Two new musicals will 

or Canadian water. The 
codfish is shipped in from 
Canada, anti the catfish 
is farm raised in the 
United States. 

"We have not had five 
complaints in nine years." 
Cook mentions, "When we 
get a complaint, I don't 
argue, I say: Throw it out 
and fix them something 
they want!" 

"I say we have probably 
got the best supportive 
customers anywhere. 
Many of them are age 50 
and up-many are on spe-
cial diets. A number of 
them have limited in-
comes." 

"Sometimes people 
come in who have real 
problems. But if they can 
spend an hour and a half 
enjoying themselves-lis-
tening to some music-or if 
we can make them laugh, 
then I feel like we've done 
something right. 

"That's the fun part of 
running the place!"  

debut in park theaters on 
opening day. Fourteen 
young performers will be 
featured in the Southern 
Palace Music Hall's 
Broadway-style revue "Do 
You Hear the People 
Sing?" 

There will be comedy 
and country music in the 
Crazy Horse Saloon's 
production called "One 
More Payment And It's 
Mine." 

Six Flags' first name 
entertainer concert of the 
season, featuring Marky 
Mark and The Funky 
Bunch and the group Ex-
Girlfriend, will be staged 
March 7 at 6 p.m. in the 
Music Mill Amphitheater. 

The second concert of 
the year will star Roxette 
and Russ Irwin. That 
show will begin at 7 p.m. 
March 13, when the park 
will be open from 5 p.m. 
until midnight. 

One feature ofthe week-
long "Spring Break Out" 
celebration will be a con-
cert on March 20, featur-
ingRythm (sic) Syndicate, 
Shanice and Right Said  

Fred. The show will begin 
at 8 p.m. 

In the case of all three 
early-season concerts, a 
fee of $2 will be charged in 
addition to the regular 
park admission. 

Six Flags will be open at 
10 a.m. each operating day 
during the spring season. 
Closing hours vary and 
are available through the 
park's Guest Information 
office at Metro (817) 640-
8900. 

ITS THE 'AWL 

YOU ALWAYS HIT 
THE MARK WITH 

THE CLASSIFIEDS 

Eastland Cleaners 
210 S. Seaman Eastland 629-3522 

New Hours  
7 AM-6 PM Mon.-Fri. - Sat. 9-3 PM 

Mon. - 3 Blouses for $6.95 reg. $9 
Tues. - 2-2pc. suits for $7.50 reg. $10 

Wed. 2 dresses (no pleats) for $7.95 reg. $10 
Thurs. - 2 Plain Skirts (no pleats) for $4.50 

reg. $6.50 
Fri. - 3 Pr. Starched Jeans for $4.95 reg. $6.75 

* ,Everyday  Special  * 
Dry Cleaning Trousers 31$4.25 

You must bring clothes in day before or 
by 9:00 AM on the day of the special. 

Pharmacy 
Topics 

? By Bob Mueller 

High blood pressure may be less dangerous for 
women than for men, a new study at Montefiore 
Medical Center in New York suggests. Doctors say 
weight loss and exercise may reduce the need for 
drugs. .* *  
Some people who thought they were allergic to 
penicillin were able to take the drug without ad-
verse reaction, studiesa t The Johns Hopkins Asthma 
and Allergy Center in Baltimore found. 

* * * 

Tighter control of blood-glucose levels before preg-
nancy helped cut the rate of birth defects in babies 
of diabetic women. Study was reported in the Jour-
nal of the American Medical Association.  

* * * 

A carrot a day... People who eat lots of fruits and 
vegetables high in antioxidants like beta carotene 
are less likely to have cataracts, say researchers at 
the State University of New York at Stony Brook. 

Acetominophen controls the pain of osteoarthritis 
of the knee as effectively as ibuprofen, even though 
it does not reduce inflammation, says doctors at the 
Indiana University Medical Center. 

* * * 

We'll help you soothe those ouches and aches with 
a wide assortment of analgesics of all kinds at 
Walmart Pharmacy Hwy 80 East, Eastland, 629- 
3347. 	 ctrsl,  10' 



AUCTION 
Saturday 	March 7, 1992 	10:00 a.m. 

Location: Downtown Rising Star - Old Higginbotham Lumber Store, Rising Star 
Items to be offered include: Oak tables & desks • 8' Science Tables • Room Dividers* 
Water Fountains • Small Chairs • Typewriters * Microscopes • 4' Flourescent Lights • 
Stadium Lights • Doors • Commodes • Insulation • 
" ROOF MOUNT HEATING/AC UNITS - Would take care of average home! " 
We will be taking consignments for this sale. To consign or for more info call (915) 676- 
4077 or Fax (915)673-6278. 

Up Coming Auctions  
2-22-92 4th Annual Grissom Farm Sale, NE of Hawley, 10:00 a.m. 
3-03-92 Taylor Co. Tax District, New Courthouse, 10:00 a.m. 
3-07-92 Rising Star ISD, Downtown Rising Star, 10:00 a.m. 
3-14-92 AHS Choir Benefit, Highland Life Center, 10:00 a.m. 
3-21-92 Big Country Baptist Assembly, Lueders, TX, 10:00 a.m. 
3-28-92 Winters ISD, Winters, TX, 10:00 a.m. 

Let us plan a Sale for you! 
We can show you how our service pays for itself! 

Johnny Kincaid Txs 6987 Jocy Kincaid Txs 10193 
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iincaid 

Service 

(915)676-4077 
2034 Lowden St., 

Abilene 

817/629.3631 OPEN 8:00 • 5:30 

SAT. 8 - 00 - 12:30 

EXPRESS PHOTO 
SAME DAY PHOTO PROCESSING 

COLOR:  BLACK L WHITE, PHOTO REPRODUCTION 

601 W. Main 
BILL CULvERHOUSE, 

OWNER 

Wedding 
Sports 

Studio Pictures 
Passports 
I D Cards 

Immigration pictures 

Serving all your 
photographic needs 

5-104 

LASSIFIEDS 	  

Cisco Press - Eastland 
Telegram - Ranger 
Times - Rising Star -
Callahan County Star 

Thursday, 
February 27, 1992 

s,,417,„7,* 1 

Country Peddler 
Show 

Folk Art • Decorating 

Apparel 

Coming to 
Abilene 

Abilene Civic Center 
March 6-8 

Fri. 4-9 • Sat. 9-6 • 
Sun. 11-5 	5.17 

Why Buy? 
Rent It! 
Spring 

Gardening 
Time 

Roto-Tillers 
For Rent 

Grandpaw's 
Tool Shed 
1304 E. Main 

Eastland 
Travis Chapman 

629-3363 s  

1111 NI MI 	110 MI NM NM 

I 	
I 

Regular i 	 I 
I $1600  1 	

I 
I 

1 	 1 
I a column inch I 
I 	 I 

Through 
March 

$1000 

Cash 

5 Papers 
1 Month 

Buy, Sell 
or Trade 

1 Col. x 1" 
Boxed Ad 
25 word maximum 

Reach 40,000 

ADVERTISE! $10 cash 
readers for just 

— Looking for a buyer for your used equipment? 
Do you have a unique product to offer? 

If so, take advantage of Eastland County Newspapers Classifieds. For $10 a column inch, 
you can reach 40,000 readers. Act now and mail your ad today to Box 29, Eastland, TX, 
76448, and it will appear for one month. 

Ad Copy 2 	  

Total Amount Enclosed $ 	  

Mail to: P. 0. Box 29, Eastland, TX 76448. 

Ad will appear in 
The Eastland Telegram 

The Cisco Press 
The Ranger Times 
The Rising Star & 

The Callahan 
County Star 

Name 	  

Title 

Phone 	 

Ad Copy 	  

Spring Cleaning Special 

$15 OFF 

Your choice 
of Panasonic 

Upright Sweepers 
Through March. 

BioGuard 
Pool Supplies 

To Get Your Pool 
In Shape Early 

Jay-Way Janatorial 
& Chemical Supply 

900 W. Main Eastland 629-2190 

POMO PIIITEI5 

You?! blossom this spring in 
skin-flattering "Powdered Pastels" 

from Merle Norman. Sweet temptations 
of peaches and mauvey pinks offer enticing 

color in a new range of softly radiant 
pastels that shimmer. 

Stop in soon and let our Beauty Advisors help you 
create your own personalized look for the now season. 

MERLE noRmAri 
COSMETIC STUDIOS 

We know how beautiful you can be:" 

Hwy 80 East 
Eastland 629-3533 
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Brandy's Boutique 
629-1219 111 W. Main Eastland 

Annual Jewelry Sale 
50% OFF All Jewelry}  

Rhinestones, 4:21  Sterling Silver, Plated Gold, Earrings 
Sale Good Through March 1 

"Kuffs" 
• • Homecoming 

To Show At Majestic M ch A
Se

t
t
Gu

a
n
r
sigh
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0. H. Ivie, West 
Texas Future Fork 
West Texas Anglers 

have for years longed for 
a well stocked, managed 
and located big lake. 
Nearing the full pool level 
of 554,000 acre feet Ivie 
stands a mere 9 vertical 
feet from this level. 

Located just east of the 
junction of the Colorado 
& Concho rivers in Con-
cho, Coleman, and Run-
nels counties this huge 
impoundment will be the 
premiere lake west of the 
Fort Worth area. In an-
ticipation of this the 
Texas Parks and Wildlife 
Department has placed 
an 18 inch-minimum 
length limit for large-
mouth bass. Having be-
gan stocking th e proposed 
area prior to the lake fill- .ing with Florida strain 
bass should give Ivie a 
fair number of legal fish 
by this fall. The stocking 
program was doubled 
above the proposed goals 
once the lake began fill-
ing in such a short time. 
12 to 16 inch fish are 
numerous at this time 
with a few keeper fish 
being taken. 

The few trips I have 
been able to make to Ivie 
have been amazingin the  

shear numbers of bass 
available. In the right 
areas anglers are report-
ing catching and releas-
ing near 100 fish a day. A 
poor day may see a hand-
ful of bites as with any 
lake. 

The current lake rec-
ord I show is just over 9 
pounds, probably a native 
of the river's prior to the 
impoundment. Heavy 
cover is the rule for the 
most part with mesquite 
trees, pecan, and cactus 
as primary cover. If plan-
ning a trip in the near 
future, spool on some 
Trilene Big Game for this 
dense cover. Spinnerbaits 
and worms are producing 
some good catches off the 
secondary points in the 
mid-lake area. 

The Angler's Choice 
Draw Tournaments for 
1992 kicked off with a 
bang at Lake Sam 
Rayburn Feb. 6-9. One 
hundred and sixty-seven 
contestants gathered for 
some excellent fishing, 
butcatching was less than 
desirable. 

David Pavlesic of Hous-
ton won out with 33.33 
for a two day total. There 
were only 3 two day lim-
its of10 fish total weighed 
in. Lendell Martin Jr. of 

The high-energy picture 
"Kuffs" will open at the 
Majestic Theatre in 
Eastland 	on 
Friday,February 28,1992, 
and run nightly through 
Monday, March 2,1992. 
Curtain time will be 7:30 
p.m., with admission 
$3.00 at the box office. 

••••....11M 

nearby Nacogdoches took 
second place with 1 fish 
27.89. 

The remaining sched-
ule for 1992 looks like this: 
March 26-29 Richland 
Chambers, May 28-31 
Lake Texoma, June 25-
28 Toledo Bend, July 23-
26 Lake Livingston. For 
more information you 
may contact Jerry Hope 
at (903) 759-3837 or 
Angler's Choice Head-
quarters (817) 326-5821. 

Don't forget the upcom-
ing Anglers Choice Team 
event for the West region 
March 8, 1992 at Lake 
Amistad. Headquarters, 
Lakeview Center. Our 
area was very well repre-
sented at the opener at 
Colorado City with seven 
teams, let's keep the 
rooster full and see an-
other of our area teams 
take first at "Big 
Friendly" Amistad. 

Terry L. Wilson 

This picture has humor 
and excitement. It begins 
when George Kuffs-the 
last guy in the world you 
would ever want to count 
on-just inherited a police 
force. Now everyone is  

counting on him. 
Christian Slater stars 

as George, a 21 year old 
high school drop-out with 
his own ideas of how to 
get the American dream. 
It's a tale laced with  

Slater's rarely seen com-
edy talent. 

He recently co-starred 
with Kevin Costner in the 
box-office hit "Robin 
Hood: Prince of Thieves," 
and in Universal's "Mob- 

sters." 
Also starring in "Kuffs" 

is Milla Jovovich, as 
Maya, a sixteen year old 
beauty. The young actress 
recently starred as Lilli 
in "Return to the Blue 
Lagoon." 

Jovovich was born in 
Kiev in the Soviet Union, 
but her family moved to 
Southern California when 
she was five years old. In 
addition to acting, she 
already has an interna-
tional modeling career. 

CHILD ABUSE 
24 HOUR HOTLINE 

1-800-252-5400 

Gunsight Baptist 
Church will be celebrat-
ing their Homecoming 
services this Sunday. The 
church started as a Mis-
sion Church off Mangum 
Baptist 5 years ago—. 

Today it is now a 
Church with a member-
ship over 140. They would 
like to invite everyone out 
for lots of special preach-
ing, singing and dinner 
on the grounds this Sun-
day, March 1st to help 
celebrate homecoming. 

Services will notbe held 
Sunday night due to serv-: 
ices most of the day. 

READ THE 
CLASSIFIEDS 

Fishing Outdoors 
by Terry L. Wilson 

George (Christian Slater) and Maya (Milla Jovovick) are a 
couple with differences to work out in 'Ruffs," beginning Feb. 
28 at the MRjestic Theatre in Eastland. 
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- 	Vote For 
Efficiency and Better 

Management of your tax dollars, 

VOTE FOR 
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DICK BURGESS 
for 

Commissioner, Precinct 3 
Eastland County 

RS10 

Pol. paid by Dick Burgess, P.O. Box 417 Carbon TX 76435 

AUCTIONS 

trail!. 

FARM c;ONStGNMENT 

Auction 
SAT.-FEB. 29 

11:00 A.M. 
ALFORD FARM 

14 MI. North of Brown-
wood on Hwy. 183 OR 
4 miles South of May 
on Hwy. 183, turn 
West on County Rd. 
423 for 11/2  miles 
(watch for Auction 
Signs). 
DUE TO THE DEATH 
OF GLEN ALFORD, 
MRS. ALFORD WILL 
SELL THE FOLLOW-
ING BY PUBLIC 
AUCTION. 

TRACTORS 
8000 FORD diesel, wide frt , 3 
pt., new overhaul & very good 
(no cab): 5000 Ford diesel w/ 
wide frt. & 3 pt. 

FARM EQPT. 
Shafer HD 8 ft. offset plow; JD 
Model B-7x20 drill; Long 12 ft. 3 
pt. tandem wiharrow; Shafer 15 
disk oneway; S bottom 3 pt. 
plow; Fergerson 4 row 3 pt. cult.: 

ME 3 pt. holedigger; JD dbl. bar 
4 row bedder w/gauge wheels; 
Red Ewald 3 pl. 200 gal spray 
tank: 2 row 3 pt. bedder; Shafer 
12 ft. wheel tandem; older 9 
shank hamey; wheel type 
shredder: Bowie 4 ft. sprig 
digger: Bermuda King 2 row 
grass sprigger. 

HAY EQPT. 
John Deere 346 bailer: New 
Holland model 490 hay cutter 
w/crimper; Tumble Bug hay 
buggies Cisco pop-up bale load-
er; 3 p1. hyd. bale spear; 10 
wheel hay rake; MF side rake. 

PEANUT EOPT 
Long Model 393 peanut 
combine; Long 2 row peanut 
digger; Fergerson 2 row digger; 
Burch 4 row planter; peanut 
sacker on wheels. 

MISC. 
Factory built 16 ft tandem 
bumper pull cattle trailer w/bow 
top; 16 tt. tandem utility trailer; 2 
in. water pump w/gas engine; 
cattle head gate; calf cradle; 
older 2 wheel trailer; 2 - mobile' 
home axels; 3 - syrup feeders; 
53 Dodge 2 ton TK. (salvage): 
1000 lb. call creep feeder; 2 
barrel hay racks; round hay ring; 
6 rolls hay wire; Roto-tiller; 4 -
new Birch planter box bottoms; 

cutter blades for New Holland 
swather; hyd. cylinders; calf 
puller. 

PLUS 
App. 293 round bales of Coas-
tal, Sundan & Cane hay; ALSO 
-1984 Ford diesel'/. ton 4 wheel 
drive pickup (pickup will be 
offered verninimum). 

CONSIGNMENTS 
The Farmers Home Administra-
tion has consigned to this sale a 
1135 Massey Fergerson diesel 
loader tractor w/Allied loader & 
duals PLUS a 8300 JD Grain 
drill. 

AUCTIONEERS NOTE: This 
eqpt. is in excellent condition. 
Not many small items • so be on 
time. 

HENRY R. 
STOREY & 

ASSOCIATES 
AUCTIONEERS 

BROWNWOOD, TEXAS 
TXS 6487 

For information 
Call 915-646-3956 at night  

SERVICES 

Cleaned, Restretched 
Repaired, Sold, Installed 

Scotch Guarding Available 
No charge for moving turn. 

Dub Meador 
Cross Plains 725-7720 

WILLIE VANDIVERE 
Dirt, Caliche Hauling 

Build Driveways, 
Lease Roads, Etc. 
9-5 Call 643-2023 

After 5, 643-6451 

Now is the time for Pond and Lake 
Stocking. Hybrid Bluegill, Florida 
Hybrid Bass, Channel Catfish, Fat-
head Minnows, Black Crappie. 

The Hybrid Bluegill will REACH the weight of 2 I/2 to 3 lbs. 
We furnish your Hauling Containers. We guarantee live delivery. 
Supplies - Fish Feeders, Turtle Traps, Liquid Fertilizer, Commercial 
Fish Cages, Bug-Light Feeders 
Delivery will be Sat., Mar. 7 at the times listed for the following towns 
& locations. 
Santa Anna-Simmons Feed & Supply; 8-9:00 a.m., 348-3168. 
Bangs-Bob's LP Gas, Seed & Feed, 10-11:00 a.m.; 752-6422. 
Brownwood-Longhom Feed & Supply, 12-1:00 p.m.; 646-8966. 
Rising Star-Coopers Texaco, 2-3:00 p.m., 643-1805. 
Cross Plains-CrossPlains Grain & Peanut Co., 4-5:00 p.m., 725-7345. 

Call Your Local Feed Store To Place Your OrderOr Call: 4051177-2202 

FISH 

TOLL FREE 1-800-433-2950 

Fishery consultant available. 
Special Deliveries on large ponds & lake orders. 

DUNN'S FISH FARM 
P.O. Box 85 

Fittstown, OK 74842 E17,12S9 

AUCTION OF  
SURPLUS EQUIPMENT  

Saturday, February 29, 1992 	 2301 Oak 

Starting at 10:00 AM 	 Abilene, TX 79608 
VEHICLE/ASSOC. EQPT: 72 GMC Sierra Grande PU; tool 
boxes; bumpers; camper shells; run boards; mirrors; deflectors; 
asstd tires; luggage carriers. 
MAJOR EQPT: Concrete saw; gas blower; pallet jacks; wallpa-
per steamer; Hi-Jack lift; gas packers; augers; butane tank; tilt 
trailer; jack hammer; Joy air compressor; light plant; insulate 
machine; paint stripe machine; 4-axle gooseneck trailer; asstd 
parts/supplies; more... 
ASSTD TOOLS: Comml shop heaters; pipe tire stand; asstd 
jacks/floor; asstd power tools; speciality tools; paint eqpt/spps; 
asstd drill bits; battery charger; elec staplers/brad nailer; air 
compressor; pipe threader; torque wrench; floor sander; janitor-
ial eqpt; concrete handling tools; asstd pumps; sewer eqpt; trailer 
hitches; lots of scrap, asstd parts/supplies; more... 
DISPLAYS/STORAGE: glass displays; asstd shelves; "open" 
neon sign. 
LAWN EQPT/SUPPLIES: Blower; edgers; lawn mowers; trim-
mers; prune tools; gas sickle; yard-lights/ornate pole lamps/ 
windmill; asstd parts/supplies; more... 
CAMPING EQPT/MISC.: Cots; butane BBQ; Mercury boat 
props; campfire coffee pot; iron skillets/griddle; Coleman heater/ 
stove; new Hasty Bake charcoal range; butane fish cooker; 
Windy Balloon machine; wheel chairs; baby beds/pens/high 
chairs; exercise bikes/belts/rollers/joggers/treadmills; asstd ofc 
eqpt/cash registers; refrigerated AC; warmer; 100 bales hay 
grazer; wheel chairs; US mail pouches; and more... 

WILL MOON AUCTION CO. 
PO BOX 5161 

Abilene, TX 79608 
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REAL ESTATE 
inammensmioniimis 

161 A. Lots of bottom land, 6G 
tillable; well fenced, 1/2 mi. 
Sabanna, good deer hunting, 
lots big oak, pecans. $550 ac. 
Agent owned. 
80.5 A. 7 mi. NE Rising Star, 
30 coastal, app. 1/2 cult.,well 
fenced, lots rd. front, $560 ac. 
95.43 A., 20 cult., 3-1 frame 
home, 4 mi. of Carbon. Good 
barn, native grasses. $70,000, 
$14,000 down, 10% int. 
70.3 A. 7 mi. E.Hy 36, timber, 
coastal, 3 water taps applied 
for, well fenced, barn, tanks, 
$500 a., cash or equity/GI 
assumption. 
182 A.-Desdemona, most 
native pasture, roiling, liveoak, 
deer, 2 BR frame home, FREE 
nat. gas, barns, corrals, fine 
well, $600 A. 1/4 down. LOTS 
pavement. 
54.35 A.-E. Carbon, most all 
good coastal, near pavement, 
well fenced, good well, 1 tank, 
minerals, $750 A. cash or (?) 
terms. 
App. 1.5 A.-E. Carbon, 2 BR 
frame home, clean, big oak 
trees, small barn, watlg insu-
lated, co-op water meter, fruit/ 
pecans, just off hwy. Just 
$20,000. 
47 A.-M/L, app. 1/2 coastal, 
qpp. 50,000 lbs. peanut quota, 
3 wells, buried mainline, wheel 
roll system, 10 HP lake pump, 
$40,000.00 

Have buyers for 
timbered, coastal, peanut, 

. retirement & pasture lands. 
35 Yrs. in Business 

COGBURN REALTY 
893-6666 	893-5898 
893-2642 	DE LEON 

assizannearaaam  

ACTION REALTY 
WE NEED LISTINGS!!! 

Equal Housing 
Opportunity 

914-643-6516 
AT RISING STAR: 
Why rent? You can be a home 
owner! This 3 BR, 2 B stucco 
has everything! Laundry, din-
ing room, carpeted, garage, 
water well. Priced to sell. 
Rock house close to down-
town. 1 BR, 1 B, dining room. 
Large tree shaded lot. Priced 
for quick sale. 
2 BR, 1 B needs some work. 
Owner's willing to finance. 
Car wash in Rising Star. 
Owner anxious to sell. Cov-
ered stalls. 
Lake Brownwood. 2 lots on 
paved road at Shamrock 
Shores. Call for details. 
Several lots for building sites 
or to put trailers on. All these 
are in Rising Star. Call today. 

James Smith, Broker 
915-646-0297 

In Rising Star Call 
STELLA WARE 
8171643-3591 

missonir 	  
PRICED TO SELL Modern 2 
BR, 2B home at 416 S. Main. 
Well built home with good roof, 
vinyl siding, CH/A, many ex-
tras. Sits on 100X80 lot, has 
good well & pump as well as 
city water, includes adjacent 
fenced lot 80X250. Call 817- 
643-3423 after 5, 	52 

Fullen Motor Co. 
305 East Main Eastland 629-2676 

Dl(; 	. --- 
coui,frity • 
CHEVROLlry 
DEEkLERS:,:.z., 

OF AMERICA 
TODAYS 
CHEVROLET 

USED CARS  
1991 GEO Prizm 4 Dr. 4-Cly., 
Automatic, w/air, AM/FM stereo 

$8,550.00 

USED CARS  
1989 Chevrolet Beretta GT 
Every Option - V6 Automatic 

$7,995,00 

1991 Chevrolet Cavalier 4 Dr. 
4-Cly., Automatic w/Air, 
AM/FM Stereo 	$7,950.00 

1990 Chevrolet Corsica 4 Dr. 
V6, Automatic w/Tilt and Cruise 
AM/FM Stereo Cassette 

$8,250.00 1991 Chevrolet Lumina Euro 
4 Dr. Windows, Locks, Tilt and 
Cruise, AM/FM Stereo Cassette 
V-6, Automatic 	$11,975.00 

1991 Chevrolet 15 Passenger Van 
V8 - Automatic, Windows, Locks, 
Tilt and Cruise, AM/FM Stereo 
Cassette Only... 	$16,550.00 

1987 Chevrolet Celebrity 4 Dr. 
V6 Automatic w/Tilt and Cruise 
Air Conditioning - Excellent 
Transportation 
Only... 	 $2,850.00 

**Full Warranty On All Vehicles 
Listed Above. 

1987 Oldsmobile 98 4 Dr. 
Super Clean - V6 Automatic 
All Your Options 
Now... $7,890.00 

Remember, if you do not see the 
new or used vehicle on our lot 
you're looking for, just let us know 
and we will locate one for you 
within two days if at all possible. 

1982 Chevrolet Caprice Classic 
V8 Automatic w/Tilt and Cruise 
AM/FM Stereo Cassette 
Super Nice Only... 	$3,250.00 

Call Collect 817-629-2676. 
Open Monday-Friday 8 a.m. till 6 p.m. Closed Saturday and Sunday 
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Statewide Classified 	Advertising Network 
Advertise in 283 Texas newspapers for only $250. 

Reach 3 MILLION Texans. Call this newspaper for details. 

 

       

HAPPY JACK MANGE LOTION: Pro-
motes healing & hair growth to any mange, 
hot spot, fungus on dogs & homes without 
cortisone. At Farmland & Double Circle 
Co-Ops & better feed stores. 
DEER HUNTERS SPECIAL: 25 acres, 
$795/acre, wooded, excellent hunting, ad-
joins paved road. Texas veteran or owner 
financing, prime acreage. Fox Realty, 500 
Buchanan Dr., BURNET, TX 1-800-725-
3699. 
ARE YOUCOLLECTING PAYMENTS on 
real estate you've sold? We'll give you 
cash now for these payments! Call Na-
tional Fidelity Corporation today! 1-800-
364-1072. 
YAK-18A (CHINESE MILITARY CJ-6A); 
all-metal Warbird, retract tricycle gear, 
flaps, 285HP radial motor. controllable 
prop, US $45,000 delivered USA. Marcus 
Bates, phone 915-333-2121, FAX 915-
563-5833. 
MAKE A FRIEND... FOR UFE1 Ccanci-
navian, European, Yugoslavian, Austra-
lian high school exchange students... 
arriving August ... host families needed! 
American Intercultural Student Exchange. 
Call tollfree 1-800-SIBLING. 
WOLFF TANNING BEDS: New commer-
cial-home units from $199. Lamps, lo-
tions, accessories. Monthly payments low 
as $18. Call today. FREE NEW color 
catalog. 1-600-228-6292_ 
BAHAMA VACATION: 5 days, 4 nights 
vacation, includes 6 hr. cruise, for two, 
$275. Call now while they last 1-800-947-
4554. 
DRIVERS: KLLM INC., Dallas and Hous-
ton terminals are now hiring experienced 
tractor trailer drivers to run 48 states and 
Canada! Call 1-800-925-5556, Monday-
Friday. 
FIRST CLASS MACHINIST, engine lathe, 
horizontal boring mill, and CNC lathe. Ben-
efits: Group Insurance, retirement, profit 
sharing. Mark's Machine Co., Inc. El 

Campo, 409-543-9204. 
DEALERSHIP LOG HOMES: America's 
finest log home manufacturer needs qual-
ity wholesalers. Earn excellent profits. Full 
or part-time. Lifetime warranty. Call Mr. 
Jones for free dealer info. 1-800-321-5647, 
Old Timer Log Homes, Mt. Juliet, TN. 
COVENANT TRANSPORT: Hiring trac-
tor trailer drivers. New equipment com-
ing in! -1 yr. O.T.R. -Teams 27-310 -In-
centives -Benefits -Minimum age 23 
-Single 19-22c East coast pay. 1-800-
441-4394. 
FREE INFORMATION ... Make a call. 
Make lots of money! Unique network mar-
keting opportunity offers substantial in-
come without investment or risk. Call free: 
1-800-767-5643. 
FREE 24 PAGE BOOK LET explains how 
you can earn a full-time income by working 
part-time from your home. No obligation. 
Call 1-800-359-9426 Ext 10. 
EXCESS SINGER SEWING Machines 
and Sergers. Due to budget cuts, the 
V.B.R. Education Department must sell 
them now. Open-arm, zig zag, blincihem, 
buttonhole, overcast, much more. Limited 
supply. Regular $329 now $148. Credit 
cards or C.O.D. Call 1-800-658-4376 Ext 
100. 
LIFTCHAIR/RECUNER: ARTHRITIS? 
Stroke? Is getting up difficult? Try our 
latchair/recliner for 10 days - free without 
obligation. We bill Medicare. $0 down fi-
nancing. 1-800-332-5-trz9. 
SERIOUS PEOPLE ONLY1Want to make 
money and/or get rich? Call for free infor-
mation 1-800-488-6927. Sales/Fuller 
Brush. 

PRINT SHOP FOR SALE. Complete com-
mercial shop, typesetting, darkroom (cam-
era etc.), presses, bindery and office furni-
ture. Owner will carry large percent for 
qualified buyer. 817-556-2737. 

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS 
NEW AND USED PEANUT EQUIPMENT 

I !LLISTON KMC 
PLANTERS - DISKS 
DRILLS - CHISELS 

ROLLING CULTIVATOR 
SELL OR TRADE 

Ciairk Tractor & Supply, Inc.  
DeLeon 	817893-2061 
Comanche 9151156-3922 

Where Your Business Is Appreciated 

JpititerNt 

Many subs 
expire Jan. 1, 

RENEW 
NOW! 

N. 	I 

L FARM 
BUREAU 

TEXAS 

RETIREMENT PLANS 
LIFE • LIABILITY 
AUTO • HEALTH 

HOMEOWNERS • FARM 

FRANK AGNEW 
AGENT 

Rising Star Office 	 Home 
817/643-1010 	 817/643-3189 

P.O. BOX 470 
EASTLAND. TEXAS 76448 

OffiCt. 817/629-1704 

R552 

Main Street 
Auto Repair 

Open Monday - Friday 8-5 p.m. 
CUSTOM MUFFLER 
& TAILPIPE WORK 

Jackie Pal more - Mechanic 

643-1701 	RS 

Hwy. 183 	 Rising Star, Texas 

The Rising Star 

elassifitbs S411 October 31. Estimated USDA benefits. Produc-
ers who have rented, 
leased, purchased, or 
otherwise acquired new 
land for 1992 must be 
certain of the erodibility 
classification of the soil 
before planting any an-
nual crop including hay 
and grazing crops. 

The 12th Signup for 
the 10 year Con serva-
tion Reserve Program 
will be held June 15-26. 
Contracts accepted dur-
ing this signup will be 
effective for the 1993 crop 
year. 

ASCS New S deficiency payments are 
as follows: Wheat, $0.65 
per bu; grain sorghum, 
0.46 per bu.; corn, 0.58 
per bu.; oats, 0.15 per bu.; 
barley, 0.35 per bu.; cot-
ton, 0.15 per bu. 

The PAY 92 provisions 
are applicable for 1992 but 
the winter wheat option 
offered in 1991 in not. 

The 1992 state pound-
age quota for Texas is 
405,030,219 pounds 
which is 2,630,066 pounds 
less than the 1991 state 
poundage quota. Initial 
notice of individual farm 
quotas are scheduled to 
be mailed on March 20. 
Individual farm notifica-
tion of the national under-
markertings are sched-
uled to be mailed on 
March 30. Transfers of 
quota by sale or lease will 
be accepted after this 
notification. 

Program partici-
pants must meet the 
highly erodible land 
conservation require-
ments to be eligible for 

FOR SALE Signup for the 1990-
1991 Disaster Assis- 
tance Program contin-
ues through March 13. 
There are no provisions 
for a late filed applica-
tion. Producers are en-
couraged to file early in 
order that all forms and 
signatures can be ob-
tained by the deadline. 
The week of March 9-13 
will be needed by county 
office personnel for com-
pletion of forms and your 
cooperation in filing early 
is appreciated. 

Signup for partici-
pating in the 1992 
Wheat, Feed Grain, and 
Cotton Progiams con-
tinues through April 17. 
Advance Payments equal 
to 40% of the estimated 
deficiency payments can 
be requested at sign up. In 
orger to better meet the 
needs of the county, the 
nongrazing date for ACR 
and CU for PAY has been 
changed to June 1 through 

LADIES OshKosh walking 
shorts, blue chambray, 3 
pockets, sizes 4-18, $29.99. 
Johnson's Dry Goods, Cross 
Plains, 	 9  
BOYS black felt hats, red band 
& eyelets, $25.99. Johnson's 
Dry Goods, Cross Plains. 9  
FOR SALE Signature 25 ft. 
chest type freezer, good con-
dition $200.00 phone 8817- 
643-2711 	 9-10  

ALL TYPES 
Vegetables, bedding & pot plants. 
Also all sizes & types of baskets, 
plus onions, fruit trees & garden 
seed. Open 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. 7 days 
weekly. 7 mi. E. Hwy 36, 11/2 mi. 
S. of Hwy 36. 

DAN'S GREENHOUSES 
Dan or Dell Hamer, RI. 2, Rising 
Star TX 76471 	6-1B 

THE RISING STAR 
817-643-4141 P.O. Box 129 
105 N Main Rising Star TX 76471 
©1992 Eastland County 
Newspapers, Inc. 
Publication No. CUSPS 
466500). 2nd class post-
age paid at Rising Star 
TX under Act of Con-
gress, March, 1870. Pub-
lished every Thursday. 
Publishers, Mr. & Mrs. H.V. 
O'Brien. Subscription  
Cates per year: Eastland 
County & 30-mi. radius 
of Rising Star, $9; other 
Texas counties, $13; out 
of Texas, $19. No out of 
J.S. without APO. Post-
masta[: Send address 
changes to The Rising 
Star, Box 129, Rising Star 
TX 76471-0129. 

LOST & FOUND 

New Construction * Add-Ons 
Steel Buildings * Remodeling 

Tape & Bed Sheet Rock 
Texture* Acoustics 

Construction 
Lynn Hutton 	 Jim Ratliff 

817 / 725-7582 	817 / 643-6464 
Cross Plains 	 Rising Star 

LOST: Reg. Blue heeler, 5 
mos. old, well markd, missing 
since Sun. night. Answers to 
Shadow. Reward! 259-3631 
Ben Cook 	 9 

HELP WANTED 
INMS111111•1 

NEEDED; LVNs, competitive 
salary. Contact Russell Gray, 
Rising Star Nursing Center, 
643-6700 	 7-52 
NEED RN relief for Sats. & 
Suns., hours 6-2 or 2-10. Sal-
ary competitive. Contact 
Russell Gray, 817/643-6700, 
Rising Star Nursing Center. 

52  
NEWLY Remodeled, 61-bed 
nursing home in Rising Star 
seeks leadership of RN Direc-
tor of Nurses; competitive 
salary, excellent working con-
ditions, Contact Russell Gray, 
817/643-670Q. 	 52 
FULL time position available 
immediatelyfor RN in progres-
sive home health setting in 
Eastland. Recent nursing 
experience required. Use your 
professioal judgment and ap-
ply your superior documenta-
tion skills. Excellent benefit 
plan, mileage paid. Call 629- 
1268, Girling Health Care, Inc. 
EOE. 	 9-1Q  

FOR RENT 

PUBLIC Housing authority of 
Rising Star has apartments 
for rent for senior citizens or 
persons with a handicap or a 
disability. Equal housing op-
portunity. 817/643-3812 or 
643-6791. 	 52 

SERVICES 

FLOYD'S HANDYMAN Serv-
ice. No job to big or too small. 
Plumbing, carpentry, carwash, 
Installations, etc. References 
available. Call Floyd Lewis 817 
643-3146 	 8-11   

/ 

JCLLINt..) YOUR Home or 
buying?Call Stella Ware, 817/ 
643-3591, your local real es-
tate agent for Action Realty, 
Brownwood, James Smith, 
broker. 	 52 

CAMPBELL'S 
Cabinet Shop 

& Construction 
Joe Campbell 

817/842-5875 
310 N. BREWSTER 4 bed-
rooms--all have walk-in clos- 
ets, 	2 full 	baths, 	all 	electric, 
wood burning fireplace, cell- 
ing fans, 3-car carport, fence, 
extra large lot, built-in hutch, 
central heat & A/C with com- 
puterized thermostat; 2,240 
sq.n.817-643-5106, 	9 

JIM RATLIFF 
WELDING 
Farm, Oilfield 
Commercial 

430 E. Mill 	Rising Star 

817/643-6464 

Mobil Oil Products!_Conoco Oil Products 

	

All Other Major Oil Brands 	' riA 	We Deliver Buli; Fuel  i .  

Cross Plains Petroleum 
(E.S.E. Inc.) 

P.O. Box 219 6th at Ave. F 
Cross Plains, Tx. 76443 

	

David and Lenell 	Sliger 	 Phone 

	

Managers 	 (817) 725-6582 

We Accept FINA, VISA, Master Card & Discover ,,,,z  

DeLeon 
IRRIGATION SUPPLY INC. 

Route 1 Box 22-A, De Leon 
Phone 893-2123 

Zimmatic Pivots • Ag Rain Hard Hose 

Guns • Cornell Pumps and all other 
types of irrigation equipment 
Complete Service And Installation 	k„= 

Paul Williams Roofing Co. 
• FREE Estimates • 

• All Work Guaranteed • 
• Hot Tar & Gravel Composition • , 

• Shingles • • 'F-Locks • • Wood Shingles • • 
25 Years Experience In Eastland Area 
Paul Williams 	Carbon, Texas 

817-639-2330 
If No Answer call 817-629-1020 	RS52 

Jeannie Sadowski 
for 17th District 
U. S. Congress 

(Republican) 
1'. 0. Box 1234 

Eastland, TX 76448 
Paid for by the Sadowski for U.S. 

Congress Committee 	BA 

OLIVER WEST 
PUMP SALES & SERVICE 

817/643-5683 
Complete Systems 

Sold & Serviced 
2 112 ml. south of Rising Star 

The following candidates 
have authorized this newpa-
pers to list their names as 
candidates for the March 10, 
1992 Primary Election. 

County Sheriff 
R.B. White 
(Re-election) 

Pistrict 17  
Representative 

Charles Stenhohn 
(Re-election) 

County  
Commissioner 

Pet. 3  
Dick Burgess 
L. T. Owen 
(Re-election) 

Constable. Pct. 3  
Howard "Gene" 

Hicks 
(Re-election) 

Pd. Pol. Advertisement 



JOHN COOK 

Moving to Eastland County? Or 
anywhere in U.S.A. Call Toll Free 1-
800-525-8910 Ext, 4365 for 
information. (No Rentals Please) 

Vet & 
GOUttcry 

REAL ESTATE 

Barbara Love, Inc: 	317 East Main 
Broker 	 Eastland, Texas 76448 

629-1725 	629-8391 

RANGER PERFECT LOCATION! Only 3 mi. SE 
Ranger! 6 ac. with 3 BR, 2B brick home. 70 to 80 trees 
MUST SEE! HMO 
PEACEFUL country living. 3 BR, 1 3/4 bath brick. A 
well kept home. Priced for quick sale! HAI 
100 ACRE PECAN ORCHARD. Highly productive; 2 
homes, farm equipment;23 ac. w/dnpirrigation. Good 
Income! H A9 
OLDEN - SELLER WILL HELP PAY YOUR CLOS-
ING COSTS! 3 BR, 2 Bath brick home on approx. 1 
acre, nice condition. HA7 
RANGER- ROOMY & SECLUDED 3 BR, l B on 1 ac., 
surrounded by pecan trees. Cen H/A, city util. H A3 
COUNTRY Inares. Beautiful oak trees 
surround th 	 th with CH/CA. HA16 
PRICE REDUCED on executive home. 3 BR, 2 1/4 
baths, beautiful pool. All on 3 acres. HA 18 
MINUTES FROM EASTLAND - Enjoy country living 
with city convenience! 3 BR, 2 bath brick home on 2.9 
acres. Under S50,000.001 HA8 
BEAUTIFUL. RUSTIC HOME on 27.8 acres: This 
5 1/2 yr. old 3 BR, 2 bath rock home has fireplace, 
jacuzzi tub, built-ins & MORE! Close to town. HA5 
RANGER - HERE IT IS! 10-1/2 Acres with large 
custom built 413R, 21/2 bath home on paved hwy., only 
3 miles from city limits. HA I 1 

ACREAGE: 
160 ACRES - NW 	Pi 	. Approx. 90 ac of 
improved gran  ..ative pasture with 
scattered trees. -ans. Passible assumption! A9 
ATTENTION DEER HUNTERS & TEXAS VF:lb! 32 

acres west of Gorman, Tx., wooded, secluded. 
Priced right! Al2 
51 ACRES between Eastland and Cisco with county 
road frontage. Possible owner finance. A4 
108 ACAINEMIlrON: Cult., 100+ Burkett 
pecan t 	 .e Own. Fin. A3 
327 ACRES - West of Carbon. Approx. 75 ac. in cult., 
improved grasses & wooded pasture. Peanut quota. 
Possible assumption! A 13 
20 ACRES • COMMERCIAL ACREAGE • Great loca• 
lion, 1-20 exit, North Access, Olden. A23 
LAKE LEON: Excellent recreation or building site! 4 
acres, highway and lake frontage. Al 
29 AC in city limits of Cisco. Hi•way front., oak trees. 
A10 
TWO BUILDING SITES: Approx. 3 acres each, with 
water meters. Highway frontage. A5 & A6 
CARBON Area; 118.5 acres, fenced & cross-fenced, 3 
tanks & equipment shed. Some minerals. Al9 
224 AC. SO. OF CARBON: Part brush, approx. 30 ac. 
coast., 2 tanks, fenced & cross-fenced. Some min. A20 
320 AC., CARBON: Improved grass & cult. Fenced & 
crotts•fenced, 5 tanks. Some minerals. A21 
16 ACRES on pavement near Eastland. Fenced, beau-
tiful oak trees. Be Quick! A 1 1 
296 ACRES North of Cisco - Native pasture with 
highway & county road frontage. 3 tanks; good hunt-
ing. A26 
155 ACRES So_ ofeisco; cultivation, pasture & wooded, 
with deer. Highway frontage. Al? 
274 ACRES - South of Cisco, Hwy. frontage. Approx. 
185 ac. Lovegrass, 40 ac. Cropland, balance timber 
windbreaks. Sandy soil, 2 wells, good fences. M5 
82 ACRES NW of Gorman: Approx. 1P2 cult. Small 
tank, hand dug wells, Minerals. A14 
245 ACRES S. of Carbon: Approx. 67 acres in cult., 
balance i n improved grasses. Underground irrigation, 
large barn wished. 12'x70' mobile home on property. 
Minerals & •;iota. A8 
OLDEN: 	SOLD 	homesite, Septic, tank, & 
wells, A2 

COMMERCIAL: 
ON THE SQUARE: 2 story bldg. in good location, 
some equip. & booths. Needs some repairs. C4 
CISCO - MINI-MALL: Large metal building on corner 
lot in excellent location on main thoroughfare. Adapt-
able for many uses! C14 
RANGER - TOWNHOUSE APARTMENT BUILD-
ING on paved street, near schools. 4 units, one needs 
interior finish. Reasonably priced for investor, or 
owner-occupant! 00 
CISCO: Excellent office bldg., 5 moms, 2 restrooms. 
Concrete parking area. In good location. C5 
CISCO, I-20: 30 wooded acres, over 500 R. Frontage on 
North Access Road, east of city limits, C6 
FANTASTIC LOCATION! Hwy. f30 E. Eastland, near 
1-20; high volume of traffic. Currently occupied as 
offices. Excellent for retail & expansion. C2 
STOP LEASING • Office Space! Now's the time to buy 
this office building. 8 spacious offices, kitchen - confer. 
mom, large reception area, plenty of parking. C3 
DRASTICALLY REDUCED! Seller says move this 
store building in excellent location on Eastland main 
thoroughfare & adjoining 3.7 acres with 5 trailer 
spaces, room for more! Don't delay!! C7 
GREAT LOCATION ON THE SQUARE! Large com-
mercial building adaptable to many yses. Cen H/A 1st 
floor, fireproof vault, moveable partitions. C9 

PEGGYE 
SWAFFORD 

647-10S0 

ROSEMARY 
FERGUSON 

653-2375 

EASTLAND: 
WOULD YOU BEI A EVE only $7,500.00 for this 2 BR, 
1 Bin excellent neighborhood? It's true! Needs T1,C. El 
WANTED! A family who needs a large 3 BR. I bath 
frame home with Cen. H/A, fireplace, fenced yard. Here 
it is! E5 
BUY ONE OR BOTH and owner will finance! 2 lots 
located in commercial/residential area, 2 blks. from 
downtown. E6 
QUALITY EXECUTIVE HOME within walking dis-
tance of all schools. Beautiful 3 BR, 2 bath home, large 
privacy fenced yard, reasonably priced. F:12 
MAKE A NOTE to see this pretty 3 BR, 2 B brick home 
in prestigious Oak Hollow add n. Won't last long! F:16 

Addn. Love 	 2 living areas, fireplace, 
PRICED*: I 	 pacious horneinCrestwoocl 

Cen. H/A. b 	- . ust See! E20 
BIG FAMILY NE___ 	.ce. Only $12,500! 

1 1P2 story 	 outbuildings! Call 
quick. E3 
3/4 ACRE - in restricted residential subdivision edge of 
Eastland. Utilities available_ Reasonable priced. EIO 
OWNER FINANCE with small down payment for 
qualified buyer! Large 3 BR, 1 3/4  bath, stuccohome on 
large lot. Needs repairs, but great potential. El I 
CRESTWOOD home reduced! 3 BR, 2 Bath, built-ins, 
Sauna nnm. £36 
CRESTWOOD CIIR, 2 bath brick home in 
pretty setting. 
GREAT NEIGHBORHOOD for growing family. 3 BR, 
2 bath brick, F/P, drapes, built-ins. Gameroom/sun- 
room. A well kept home. El7 
EARLY 1900'S HONISAW. Mirgagame home on large 
lot in desirable loco 	 'ration. 9 moms, 2 
baths. £4 
AFFORDABLE! Below $10,000.00! 2 BR, 1 13 frame on 
kg fenced lot. Needs interior. work, great for handy. 
man! E2 
FIXER UPPEllicaome on corner lot. 
BEAUTIFUL tree aded corner lot with 4 BR, 1 bath 
frame home,formal dining mom. E22 
ONE OF A KIND - Custom built; large 3 BR, 2 bath 
brick home in Crestwood Addn. Split BD arrangement; 
wet bar, large kitchen with island, Rock fireplace; 3-car 
garage. Price lower for quick sale. E32 
NEAT! 2 BR, 1 bath, w/den or 3rd BR plus dining room; 
CH/CA, privacy fence surrounded by lg. oak trees. £31 
PRICE REDUCED on this 311R, 1 bath brick home with 
personality plus! Great location; 3 tree shaded lots. 
Under $40,000.00! El4 

OTHER 
CARBON: 2 BR, I bath on corner lot. 012 
STRAW/N.1=1r en. H/A, some built-ins; 
outbuildin 
RISING SCAR - JUST LISTED! 3 BR, 1 1/2 bath brick 
home on corner lot. Cen, H/A, kit. builtins. Possible 
owner finance or FHA. 011 
RANGER: Historical home! Unique & authentic decor, 
3 BR, 3 bath, brick home 3-F/P, study, sun-mom, 
stained glass windows. Great for entertaining or grow-
ing family. 01 
RISING STAR • NEWLY REMODELED 2 BR, I bath, 
Central heat on extra large corner lot; water well for 
garden. 07 
RANGER - LOOK HERE! PRICE REDUCED on large 
3 BR brick home on shaded corner lot. Many amenities. 
010 
LAKE LEON - PRETTY 2 BR, 2 bath brick home on 
large waterfront lot. Cen. H/A, fireplace, boat dock and 
MORE! CALL TODAY!03 
RANGER - Custom built 5 yr. old unique kick over-
looking city. Many amenities. 030 
RANGER • Large home for growing family. 3 BR, 2 
bath, CH/CA, DR, fenced yard. Priced right. 031 
NEAR LAKE LEON: Nice dbl. wide 3 BR, 2 bath, built-
ins, CH/CA, on 1/4 acre w/ lake view, trees.029 
CARBON: Stflith frame home. Owner 
financing w/a 	 )11 
GORMAN:Numerous list., $8,000-$45,000. Call for de-
tails. 
LAKitre 	 ,.. 0  ter. 	lot, Staff meter, 
fruit  
PICTURESQ 	 -early new 3 BR, 2 bath 
brick home 	 ly fenced lot. Well for 
outside use. Manother amenities. 018 
DESDEMON 	 bath older frame with 
outbuildings o 	 • owner financing! 025 
RANGER • DRASTICALLY REDUCED FOR QUICK 
SALE! 3 BR, 2 bath rock veneer home in Meadowbrook 
Addition. Affordable! 08 
RANGER-2 Blerita home on shaded lot. 

fi Owner nanan_ 	 yer. 032 

HOUSE & ACREAGE: 
TREES,TREES GALORE surround this beautiful brick 
home w/sun room on 1.77 ac., city water & well. Coun-
try living minutes from Eastland or Ranger. HA4 
CISCO: BEAUTIFUL RURAL SETTING! 3.4.5 acres 
with 1 1/2 story 4 BR, 1-3/4 bath frame home at edge of 
city limits. Pecan, oak trees, MORE! HA6 

BARBARA LOVE 	CINDYE FOSTER 
647-1397 	 629-8227 

'Xs-, Vadat Reed Sal& 
P. 0. Box 693 - Eastland, Texas 76448 

R.G. (Buck) Wheat, Broker 

629-2365 	 629-8514 

EASTLAND HOMES  
ABOVE 5100.000 

ELEGANT 4 BR, 23/4 bath, on lovely S. Seaman, all amenities, $110,000. 

125,09s 
DIXIE STREET CHARMER, 3 BR, 1 3/4 Bath, Brick, Lots of extras, $79,800. 
RAMBLING ROCK (TOME, Large 3BR, 1 3/4 bath, on 1 Ac., I Iwy. 6, $79,500. 
EXTRA NICE 3BR, 1 3/4 bath, brick on 2.77 ac., Hwy 6, $76,000. 

560.000 •$75.000 
EXCLUSIVE OAK HOLLOW, 3BR, 1 3/4 bath, brick, super home! $69,500. 
TWO FOR ONE, Brick Duplex, 3 BR, 1 3/4 bath ea. side, Nice! $69,000. 
SPACIOUS VICTORIAN, Eight rooms, central heat & air, comer lot, $68,500. 
CRESTWOOD ADDITION, 3 BR, 1 3/4 Bath, Brick, JenreAire, & more! 
$68,500,  

LAKE LEON, Near Darn (Did Not Flood), Family home, gorgeous lot, $68,500. 
CUSTOM BRICK in Olden, 3 BR, 1 3/4 bath, on 1 Ac., fenced, $63,900. 
OLDEN BEAUTY, 3 BR. 1 3/4 Bath, Brick, on 22 Ac., Must see! 560,000. 

540.000 • S60.000 
COMFORTABLE 3 BR. 1 3/4 Bath. 3 Fireplaces, Custom drapes, $59,900. 
CONTENTED CARBON, Pretty 3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick, corner lot, $52,000. 
WALK TO TRACK FIELD, 3 BR, 1 3/4 Bath, Brick, Sep. Liv. Areas, $51,000. 
HALLENBACK ROAD, Lake Leon Waterfront, 2 BR, 2 Bath, Staff meter, 
$45,000. 

TOO CUTE! 3 BR, 2 Bath, Country Horne en one-half Ac., CIUCA, $45,000. 

$20.000 $40.00Q 
MASSIVE 4 BR, 23/4 Bath, frame whiding, huge mu., Just $39,000. 
I IOME ON TILE HILL, 2 BR. frame w/siding, several wooded lots, $35,000. 
LAKE LEON, 2 Deeded lots w/14'x80' mobile home, Elec. boat lift, $35,000. 
LAKE LEON, 2 lots, Staff meter, older house, good deep water, $35,000. 
BRIG1IT & AIRY, 3 BR, 2 Bath, Large mu, titian. nook, FP, $34,000. 
COZY 2 BR on 4 beautiful wooded lots, assumable loan, $29,400. 
WALK TO TOWN, Neat & clean 2 BR, Central heat, Assumable FlIA, $28,000. 
ACROSS PROM GOLFCOURSE, 3 BR. 2 B &ch. Doublewide on 1 Ac.. S27,500. 
ASSUMABLE LOAN, 3 BR, I 3/4 Bath, CIUCA, Builtins, comer lot, $27,000. 
BEST BUY! 2 BR, Brick, Central Heat & air, appliances. $26,000! 
GIANT PECAN TREES & Several lots go w/this 3 BR, nice shop bldg., 525,000. 
COUNTRY LIVING IN TOWN, 2 BR, 2 Bath, Modem Kit., CH/CA, 3 ac., 
$25,000. 

NEAT NEIGI IBORHOOD, Large 2BR w/deta cheat apt./gar., new listing, $22,000. 
RESIDENTIAL OR COMMERCIAL, 4 BR frame, beside convenience store, 
$24,000. 

CHEERFUL YELLOW 2 BR, Frame w/siding, 1000 sq. ft. shop bldg., 322,000. 
ESTATE SALE, 2 BR, on two lots, Two 2-car sheds, stor. 	$20,000. 
BARGAIN PRICE on this 2 BR, frame w/siding, Ci KA, fenced, Just $20,000. 

UNDER 520.000 
2 BR Mobile I lame on abt. 3/4 ac., central air, horse stalls, $19,500. 
2 BR, 2 Bath Mobile I tome, CH/CA, Carpet, appliances. $19,500. 
3 BR FRAME, Older bane, Needs some TI.C, but priced accordingly. 516,000. 
2 BR, 2 Bath Mobile Home, CH/CA, Builtins, $12,000. 
LAKE LEON, DEEDED WATERFRONT LOTS, Starting at $6,000. 
LAKESIDE COUNTRY CLUB AREA, 5.29 Ac. overlooking Golf Course, 
$8,000. 

CARBON, 3 LOTS, City utilities, good area, $3,000. 

ACREAGE 
160 AC., Near Morton Valley, 2 BR Home, barns, out-bldgs., some cultivation, 
fenced & crossfenced, S550 ac. 

150 ac., Near Moran, city water, fenced & crossfenced, highway & county road 
frontage. $425 ac. 

252.5 ac., S. of Carbon, very isolated, Sabana River runs through property, older 
homc, hunter's paradise. $400 ac. 

100 a c., mostly grass & wooded, excellent fences, 2 tanks, city water, good hunting, 

$6  a75ca:M 166Mostly pasture, corner tract, could divide, $550 sc. 
6.61 to 503 ac., Near Olden & Ranger, seller finance, hunting land. 

COMMERCIAL 
1.20 & May 6 Area, 2 Lots, $12,500 & 15,000. 
Ha) SO East, Eastland, 3 Extra special lots; $30,000, $40,000, $70,000. 
lia %ham Electric & Rogers Gro. bldgs., $12,000 & $7,000. 
NEW LAUNDROMAT, Tum-Key, $75,000; Plus Approx. 50 ac. Prime commer- 
cial property, $4,000 per ac. 

FOR RENT;.2 BR, I Bath, 5325; 3 BR, 1 bath, 5300; 4 BR, 2 3/4 bath, 5375/ 

WE OFFER COMPLETE RENTAL MANAGEMENT SERVICES, 
WE SPECIALIZE IN "AFTER FIVE" & WEEKEND SHOWINGS. 

WE APPRECIATE THE OPPORTUNITY TO SERVE YOU. 

Ann Williams 
REAL ESTATE 

610 Conrad Hilton Ave., Cisco 

442-1880 
Business & Home Phone 

CISCO HOMES 
Discover What Your Dollar Can Do. Homes priced 
under $12,000. Some with owner fin, at $150 month. 

Bargain Buy 1 tan, 3BR Frame, enclosed 
porch, corne SOLD 

Only $12,500. and possible owner finance! 3 BR, 2 baths, 
CH/CA, garage. 

Big House, Small Price! 2 story frame plus large attic, 
corner property, only $13,500., owner fin. available. 

Numerous Large Pecan Trees Surround this spacious 2 
BR home, CH/CA, garage, carport, storage bldgs. 

Seller Anxious, make an offer, 3 BR, 2 baths, 2 1/2 lots, 
asking $15,000., owner financing. 

Room To Ramble  SOLD  s, formal DR, 2 car 

Ideal F 
garage, owner fi 	 8,000. 

SOLD BR, formal DR, CH/CA, garage, 
large 

Explore the Value, 2 BR brick, CH/CA, 5 lots, city water 
plus well, $25,000. 

Possible Financing For Low Income Family, 2 BR brick, 
central heat, workshop, large carport. 

Fantastic Kitchen, cabinets galore, spacious 3 BR, 2 
baths, LR, DR, den, CII/CA, 2 carports. 

Home Sweet Home, 3 BR, 2 bath brick, large family 
room, CH/CA, 2 storage bldgs, patio, carport. 

Search Is Ended' 'SOLD brick, CH/CA, double 
garage, covere• 

Pride of Ownership - nice 9 , 2 bath, CH/CA, den or 
office (could be 4th BR), fireplace in LR, garage. 	• 

Victorian Home with Character, spacious 3 BR, 2 baths, 
formal LR, DR, den, woodheater, carport, fantastic 
yard, gazebo, insulated shop. 

Need Space? Approx. 3500 sq. ft., 4 BR, 3 1/2 baths, 
numerous oversized closets, 2 CH/CA units, fireplace, 
large yard, many extras. 

LAKE CISCO - Several Homes and Cabins to choose 
from, call for more information. 

VACANT LOTS - 24 adjoining lots $14,500.; also 12 
adjoining lots $9,400., plus some individual lots, 

SMALL AND LARGE ACREAGE 
Only $22,500., 2 BR frame, fireplace, carport, several 
outbuildings, approx. 2 acres. 

Reduced to $33,000., nice brick home with CH/CA and 
guest house on approx. 1 1/2 acres, orchard, city water, 
just outside city limits. 

Approx. 61 acres, cultivation and wooded acreage, home 
under construction needing someone tofinish, $39,500. 

Beautiful 3 BR, 2 bath brick home, CH/CA, fireplace, 
enclosed porch, garage, approx. 5 acres. 

Spacious 3 BR, 2 bath country home on approx. 312 
acres, mostly wooded, several tanks, near Cisco. 

COMMERCIAL 
$4,500 - lot 70' x 94'. 
$10,500 • 3.7 acres located on excess road off Interstate 20. Will 

Owner Finance. 
517.500 - 180' x 150' land on N. Service Road. Will Owner Finance. 
$98.503 • 3BR. 1 1/2 bath, CH/A, 'Friendship' mobile home on 2 

acres of Interstate 20 frontage. Plus a 50' x 70' metal building whh 
20' x 70' attached metal shed on side. City water. Exceptional 
commercial location. 

$110,000 - 38.693 acres of commercial property on Interstate 20 S. 
access Rd. 50' x 100' metal building with partition N. to S. through 
building. Makes twooffices ortwolying quarters. Approx. 5,000 sq. 
ft. CH/A. Possible owner finance. 

$487,000 -SLEEPHOUSE - New 30 unit motel on 2.6 acres with 213R 
managers' apartment, metal construction la low maintenance, 
picnic area and laundry facilities, window units with heat and A.G., 
in addition to back-up solar unit. Excellent opportunty for lucrative 
investment, 

barns, storage buildings plus furnished workshop, city water, and 
water well. Ornate rail fencing. Pecan. Walnut and hurt trees, pond 
stocked with bass. 

550.000.4 BR. 1 large bath, home with fireplace, two large concrete 
patios. 7 mins. from Eastland. School bus stops at properly. Small 
6 room home on property may be used for rental or guest home. 
Both homes located on 23 acres with water wetland deep tank Only 
utility paid is electric and averages less than $100.00 per month. 

559.000 - 2 BR, 1 bath house on 34.6 acres, CH, newly remodeled 
with lots of cabinets, new plumbing and wiring. built -in microwave. 
water wen, storage building, large utility room, 26 producing pecan 
trees, 2 septic systems, cultivation and ail fenced. 

566,000 • 3 or 5 bedroom, 2 1/2 bath, new brick home on 5.7 acres 
approx. 2,000 sq. ft. CR/A, fireplace, kitchen built-ins, walk-In 
c-ets, large utility room, carport with storage and workshop, 
cyclone fence, barn with plumbing and electricity. 3 storage build-
ings and tank. 

$69,000 - 3 BR. 2 bath home on 10 acres near city limits. Home has 
lovely oversized windows, mirrored wall and ceiling fans. kitchen 
with built-ins and lots of storage. Cable T.V., city utilities, swing set. 
stock tank and hot house, 2 car garage and 25' x 25' boat garage. 

$72,000 - 3 BR, 2 bath brick home on 10 acres, CI-LiA, double car 
garage. TV, Sateiate, total electric, storage house. Any mineral 
rights owned to go buyer. 

$76.000 - 3 BR - 1 314 bath, beautiful brick home on 2.67 acres, CH) 
A, built-Ins, ceiling fans, patio/deck, fireplace, double car garage 
and fenced yard. 

$80.000 - 3BR. 2 bath. triple wide on 28 acres, 2.130 sq. h., ail fenced 
and cross fenced, barn, stock tank, Staff meter. Totally private. 

$80,000 • Beautiful country home on 10 acres, 3 or 4 bedrooms, 2 1, 
2 baths, 2 story lack approx. 3.000 sq. ft. CH./A, I ireplace, built -ins. 
lots of storage and closet space and lots of extras. 

$85,000 - 3 BR, 2 bath home with approx. 3,072 sq. ft. on 6.1 acres. 
New home with oak parquet flooring, built-ins, large recreation 
room. 2 car garage and storage building, city water. Excellent 
hunting and fishing in area. 

$89.500 - 3 BR. 3 bath, bnck country herrn, located on 6 acres, large 
home is elegant, with built-in mictowave,sell-cleanIng ovens.Jenn-
Air cook island and ceiling fans throughout. Largeconaeteporches. 
patio and private, brick-walled garden off master bedroom. Fire-
place with heal-o-later. Big, sunny garden room, beamed and 
vaulted ceilings. 	bookshelves and cabinets, Wal-in closets, 
with built-in organizers. Cable T.V. hookups in every room. Garden 
lights, electric garage door lifts on 3 car garage. Workshop, barns, 
and metal corrals. Fruit trees and oak pecan and pine. Irrigation 
system for trees and garden. CH/A, superior Insulation and energy 
efficient home, Perfect condition. 

$95.000 - 3 BR. 2 bath frame house with siding on approx. 80 cres. 
CH/A, built-ins. wood burning stove, huge porch, utility room. 
store building. small barn, hay shed and coital. 

$126, 	• 3 BR. 2 bath. approx. 3,000 sq. ft., home on 162 acres, 
located 15 mins. from Eastland. CHrit, sunken den with cathedral 
ceilings. New. built-in appliances in kitchen. 3 car carport, garage 
and workshop. Barns and pons, corrals and horsestalls.Creekruns 
through property, 6 acre lake stocked with bass and channel cat. 
Prime hunting acreage. 

5135.300 • 3 BR, 2 bath, big, beautiful, lavish now brick home on 65 
acres. CI-1/A, citywater, 3 car garage with electric openers, custom 
kitchen with oak cabinets, all appliances buat-n. Jenn-Air island 
range. refrigerator, wine racks, sell-cleaning double ovens, dish. 
washer, microwave. Matching storage house, indirect lighting and 
skylights. T.V. satellite and controls. hug he utility room with count-
ers and built-in ironing board, central phone and cable hook-ups 
and vacuum in all rooms. Bedroom with built-in oak desks, book-
shelves, window seals, storage units and walk-in closets, WII 
owner finance at 10% down. 

$159,000 - 4 BR, 2 bath, five year old brick home on 122 acres. 
Located 8 mins.trom Eastland. Approx. 2.000 sq. ft.0 HIA, separate 
dining, utility room, total electnc. All land In coastal bermuda City 
water plus well and dii. tank. New corrals and fencing. 1/2 mineral 
rights go to buyer. R. • building for barn. 

$165,000 - 4 BR. 4 1/2 bath, supenot and modern home with 1 1/2 to 
15 acres. An excess of extras. CH/A, skylights, sewing room, 
heonousermous master bath. Property included an additional small 

$180.000 - 3BR, 2 bath, brick and siding home with approx. 2.600 sq 
ft.. CH/A, native pecans and coastal grass. Branch of Leon River 
runs through this outstanding property. Approx. 1/4 mineral rights 
go with property. City water. 5 mins_ fr om E astland. Home is located 
on 220 prime area acres. 

5180,000 • 3 BR, 3 bath, approx. 4.050 sq. ft.. country home located 
on 223.7 acres. CF-UA, 	ins, rock fireplace with corner hearth 
and heat-o-later. Lots of cabinets and storage. Covered patio on 3 
sides. 62 acres in coastal, 8 tanks. 2 barns and 1/4 mineral rights. 

$197,000 • 3 BR. 3 bath, big, beautiful brick home on 51 acres. CH. 
A, builtans, utility room. 3 pantries, sewing room, fireplace. Kitchen 
bar with all new cook top, double ovens, trash compactor, dish-
washer and water softener. Patio with bar-b-que, swimming pool. 4 
separate horse lots with covered stalls, cattle crowding pen and 
scheeze chute. Two horse starting gates, metal shod and 10 stall 
barn. 

$317,000 - "Showplace' home on 100 acres of 'Country Club' 
property. 3BR. each with private bath. Separate office. Kitchenwith 
bult• in icemaker, wine rack, double sell-cleaning ovens, Jenn-Air, 
blender, etc. on spcp-up" home center, counter controls. Revolving 
kitchen shelves with organizers. Room-to-room, built-in organizers 
and shoo storage. Hugh master bath with private patio:Watching' 
15' x 30 storage house. All electric underground conduits, great 
fencing. Professionally decorated and landscaped. 

ND 	 ANCHE 
ac REA  

$8.500 -  7.5 acres wit sma tan surroun 	by willows, access to 
Olden water. Possible owner finance. 

$21.003 • 40 acres $525.00 an acre. E lect ricity, stocked tank, fenced 
528,001-40 acres electricity and city water on property. In Olden. 
528,000 • 40 Acres on Hwy 183, water well and tank, fenced, pecan 

trees, 1 metal shed. 
$31.200-52 acres-$600.00 per acre. Good hunting and fishing. 20 

minutes from Eastland. 
540.000-80 acres-$500.00 an acre with access to electricity and city 

water. Hand dug well and large, spring-fed tank. 10 x 12 Metal 
building on property. Land paniahy cultivated. 

$43.000 - 80 acres in Carbon area, cultivation, water well, stocktank, 
barn, fences and Mineral Rights. 

543,000 • Approx. 54 acres, excellent fencing all around, barn. 3 
tanks. city water, electricity, paverrents on 2 sides. 4 min. from 
town. 

00 54 	- 80 acres. $600.03 per acre, 15 minutes from Eastland 
(east). 1 tank, excellent hunting and fishing. 

$74,303 • 167 Acres, $454.00 per acre. good hunting and production 
land lust west of Cisco. 

$91,300 - 166 acres. $550.00 per acre, near Eastland Lake. Can bo 
divided into 40 or 80 acre tracts. Good fences, barn and pens. 

360 acres at 5530.00 per acre. All owners rrineral rights go with sell. 
3 tanks, good fences, hand dug well, over a mile of 1-20 frontage. 

411 acres at 5550.00 per acre, 3 tanks stocked with bass and cartes h, 
fenced and cross-fenced, 1/3 in coastal, buildings. corrals and 
loading chute. 

1,178 acre ranch al $340.00 per acre. fenced and cross fenced. south 
of Carbon. Excellent hunting area. 

Pecan Orchards available. 

EASTLAND HOMES AND, LOTS 
-  2 Residential lots 50' x 140 on N. Virginia St. Some trees. 

$5.000tor two lots Si town, electricity and water available. 
55.000-2 BR, 1 Bath, frame hone on shady lot. Will sell in 'as is' 

condition. May be used for commercial or residential venture. 
$6.000-3 BR, 1 Bath on good city lot. Very little needed to make a 

really cute home. 
37,500 - Lovely lot on exclusive Oak Hollow. 
$7,500 • Large 2 1/4 acre lot near schools. 
$9,000- Flve 100' x 200' lots or may be sold separately for $2,500.00 

oath. 
S10,030 - Four hillside residential lots in exclusive location. 
$10,000.3 BR, 1 Bath, frarre home with siding. On spacious, shady 

and totally fenced lot. Ci-VA with heat pump. 
$12,503-Two centrally located homes on two adjoining lots. Needs 

work for groat investment possibilities as homes or rental prop. 
$16,800 - 3 BR, 1 bath lovely home in a ideal neighborhood. Large 

shady yard. 
$20,000 • 2 BR, 1 bath home in good neighborhood. CI VA fenced 

back yard. 
528.003 • 3 BR. 2 bath double wide mobile home on large lot with 

Pecan and Elm trees. CH/A, 	stove and microwave, washer 
and dryer hook-ups, carpet, covered front porch, patio. 2 car 
carport, large storagebuilding. Completely underpinned and in very 
private area of town. 

529.500-2 BR. 1 Bath frame with siding. Completely remodeled 
interior. New carpet. Built-in oven and counter top range. Superior 
insulation in walls and ceiling. New plumbing and winng. Doable 
carport. Large patio. 

S32,000:4 BR. 1112 bath frame home and nice neighborhood. Built-
in double oven, large utility room and fenced back yard. 

540,000 • 2 BR. 2 bath lavishly remodeled home in elite neighbor-
hood, double car garage, workshop, and storage facilities, magn di. 
cent yard. 

542,403 - 3 BR, 2 bath new brick with siding home In city limits, on 
large lot. CH/A. large windows, and lots of storage. 

556,000-4 BR, 1 12 bath, two story formal and elegant home with 
European touches. Red tile roof with stucco wood exterior. Im-
ported fixtures, exquisite wallpaper, appointments and chandeliers 
from Spain and Italy. A truly lavish home, greatly underpriced. 
Located on three large lots, this home has energy efficient CH/A. 
attic fan. excessive insulation and storm windows. Separate A/C 
studio, guest house, or office building located at back of property. 
Trees in abundance, storage house, fish pond, and much more. 

358.000 • 3 BR, 2 bath beautrful brick home total elec, double car 
garage w/electric openers. Professionally land sca,oed. extra build-
ing w/plurnbing, phone hookup, 24 x 34 storage house, and 12 x 14 
barn. 

560.003-3 BR. 2 Bath, frame with siding home on 1 1/4 acres. Built. 
in, CH/A. swimming pool, game room. Unique and energy-efficient 
home located across street from gen course. 

374,000 -3 8 R. brick home with approx. 1,650sq. ft CHJA;tiled toyer, 
fireplace, walk-in closets with organizers and shelves, big windows 
with treat view, 2 car garage Nee/electric openers. Large utility room. 

574,,  n  - 4 BR, 3 bath, double A.C. system. Beautiful back yard, 
lanced, lovely neighborhood. spacious game room, built-ins. plus 
Jenn-Aire range. 3 additional bldgs. 

379,000 • 3 BR, 2 bath, large brick home with cathedral ceiling. 
Excellent location in shady and quiet nehborhood. Large, beau-
tiful game and sun room.Two car garage with electric door openers. 
Formal Irving room, fireplace and built-in desks, bookshelves and 
cabinets in den and living area Storage house. Truly lovely and 
-perfect condition' home. 

386.000 - 3BR, 2 bath brick home, garden bath and mirrored closets 
and bathrooms add a dramatic touch to this extremely unique 
house, CHIA, energy efficient. Fantastic wet-bar with awning and 
luxurious decorator touches throughout this hone. Rock fireplace 
and beamed ceiling. All kitchen appliances built-in, with Jenn-Air 
island range and breakfast bar. Large private lot In very exclusive 
part of Eastland. 

LAKE LEON HOMES AND LOTS  
33.950 • Two lake front lots at $3,950. each. 
S16,500- 100' x 150' waterfront Id, septic system, electricity, cement 

patios. walkways and steps to lake. 24' x 24' metal workshop with 
double doors, cement floor and florescent lighting. Two 500 gal. 
butane tanks, boat dock and beautiful landscaping. 

517,000. 2 BR. 2 bath. 14 x 70 Titan motive nom° on 5,344 acres. 
Stall meter. fenced, carport, storm cellar, storage house, 250 gal. 
butane tank and big T.V. antenna. 

518.503 • 3 BR, I bath mobile home in private and gorgeous green 
wooded and cyclone fenced in area Staff meter, 500 gallon butane 
tank Fruit and pecan trees. Great water front property_ 

$22.003 • Two deeded lots on pnme lake frontage near Lone Cedar 
Country Club. Small boat dock, deep water. 

$25.0e0 • Large cabin with bath, hugh screened in porch, stove. 
refrigerator, refrigerated window unit, waterfront lot approx. 100' x 
200' on deep water. Lake pump and filtration system. 250 ga. 
butane tank. PrNate area of the lake. 

$27,800 • Cabin on two lots on Lake Loon waterfront. Fireplace. 
stove, refrigerator, built-in drawersandcabinets inbedroorrt cement 
porch and two walk-ways to lake. 

$27,800 - 4 BR, 2 bath home built mobile home of approx. 1600 sq. 
ft., CH/A. carport, 2 storage buildings with workbench and organu• 
ars. Guard lights, front and back. Large cement patio. T.V, Satellite, 
total electric and energy efficient. Irrigation system! or lawn and fruit 
treesplus grape vineyard. Kitchen has butt-ins, dishwasher, break-
fast bar, separate dining area, large windows and custom drapes. 
Wood burning stove with winters supply of cord wood. 

329.800 - 2 BR. I bath home on deeded hot, large kitchen, pump 
house with purrp, 

330,003 • 2 BR. 1 bath mobile home on deeded lot. Great walk way 
and boat dock and cemented. covered pazio area. Private and 
serene location. 

335,030 • 2 Bedroom, 2 bath mobile home located on approx. 100' x 
I 95' waterfront lot with dock on deep water. Lake pun-p and filtration 
system. C14/A. TN. and satellite and remote and local reception 
antenna, ceiling fans. ref rigerator, stove,washer and dryer. 5iM gal. 
butane bank, storage building. 

547,500 - 2 BR, 2 bath, gorgeous mobile home with matching storage 
house. CH/A. kitchen boll-ins including dishwasher, Cathedral 
ceilings, cement dock and boat ramp. Butane tank and start meter, 
excellent lake frontage property. 

355,003. 3 BR, 2 bath frame home on 5 acres of very private Lake 
Loon property. Staff meter, carpet, paneling, large closets, huge 
utility room, covered back porch, garage with storage. storage 
building. Small pond in front yard, cultivation on property and tank 

363.000 - 2 BR, 1 bath, frame metal with wood home, overlooking 
lake, on deeded lot. CH/A, Satellite, large storage house. Ceiling 
fans throughout, breakfast bar with custom chairs, interior S done 
in master crafsrrenshp of construction, plumbing and wiring, bull-
's with superior design. 

565.400 - 3 BR. 2 bath, total electric. Beautiful and unique lake home 
on 125' x 350' lot. Butit• ins. range, oven and dishwasher. Cathedral 
ceiling. large. spacious rooms with walk. in closets. New carpet and 
fireplace. Two storage buildings, staff meter and lake purrp. Apn• 
ciode.ocohe ry, and many other fruit and native trees Possible owner I   

385,400 • Gorgeous 2 bedroom home on LakeLea, waterfront, large 
krichen, lots of cabinets and storage. big screened In porch, double 
sided tire place total elect., built in book shelves. Redwo eiderntk 
white rail fenong, double car port arid guard lights. LvIt  
workshop, 2 horse stalls, paved parking tractor. separate guest 
house, walkway. and dock, fruit trees and ducks go too. 

$' 25.000 -Beautiful 3,000 sq. ft two story home on one acre of water 
,ront property. CH/A. Staff meter, total electric, kitchen with all buill• 
as, glassed in kitchen cabinets, kitchen bar and china cabinet. 
Master bedroom with beautiful tub area with 4 x 5 marble shower, 
huge sunroom and sitting area, sliding door to huge deck with 
benches. Large utility and laundry room with sink, closets and Ids 
of storage. 2 car garage with HA. floodlights. So many extras, must 
see to believe. 

53,000-28 lots on 5 acres. Two 	home hook-ups. Cray water, 
sewage and electricity, Cedar rail fencing. Ideal for mobile home. 

516,406-24.35 acres. 
517.000 - 2 BR, 1 bath with siding, CI-I/A attached carport and 

storage, excellent condition. 
523.375-42.5 acres. 
$25.000. 3BR. 1 bath brisk home, CKA in good location. In excellent 

condition 
525.300-40.5 acres. Good tank 
$28,100-48 87 acres. electricity. 
$30,003 - New commercial building of Austin Stone on main mot-

oughfwe. Totally cyclone fenced tri office and work area. 
535.000 • 56.3 acres with good tank 
$53.600 new 2500 sq ft. convenience store on 1 acre. Enormous. 

walk-in cooler, three 8,000 gallon underground gas tanks. 
563.800 - 3 BR, 2 bath brick home with gorgeous yard. Master 

bedroom with private patio, C1-1/A, fireplace. built-in shelves, built-
in kitchen appliances, double car garage with electric openers, 
storage building with workshop. Lots of extras. 

CARBON 
52.250-1 BR, kitchen and Irving room. Approx. 600 sq. h. home. 

53,500-2 Large lots. Three large pecan trees on front of tots. Fenced 
on three sides. Hook ups available for all city utilities. 

S12,000-3 BR. 1 bath home on 2 tots wrth trees and garden. A small, 
comfortable home In good repair. 

$15.003-3 BR. 2 bath lovely mobile home on two lots. Cyclone fenced 
20 x 18 shop and 14 x t4 stodazit2zudding. 

$10.730-3 B R.2 bath. approx. 2500 sq. h. home on 1 1/2 acres. Hook 
ups for two mobile homes on back of property. 

514.003 • 2 storys, commercial building approx. 3.000 sq. ft bath-
rooms upstairs and down, 2 front doors. 100' x 300' deep. 

$15,000 - 2 BR, 1 bath mobile home on 2 lots, fenced completely 
storage building, screened front porch, carport, and corrals. 

$17,000 • Commercial budding, 2 story, approx. 1350 sq. ft. double 
display windows in front. Includes ad fixtures, dressing rooms, 
bathroom, carpeted. CH/A, built-In bins, shelves, racks and mirrors. 

554.000-Commercial building with residence in rear, (3 BR, 2 1/2 
bath), 175' highway frontage. 

H91,5E§ WITH 
532,503 - OLDER HOME • BR., bath 

ACREAGE  
on 

approx. 14 wooded acres Staff meter, 2 tanks, stocked with Catfish 
and Bass. Private and Lovely. 

$43.500 • 3 BR, 2 bath, lovely new country horne on 10 aces of land, 
CH/A, total electric, inlaid oak flooring, big sky light, chain knk fence 
around house and one acre. 

$47,800- 14 x 80 complete furnished mobile home, CH./A, additional 
,om bull on eleven acres. Fenced and cross fenced, horse stalls, 

ELIZABETH MAYNARD 
ASSOCIATE 
559-2318 

THOMAS 
B 
H. HENNINGTON 
ROKER 

DEBRA MAYNARD 
ASSOCIATE 
629.8568 

J • • • • • • Ir • • • • • • • • • • • • • State Representative Cook To Be 
Speaker At Leon-Bosque Resource TUC To Award Scholarships To 

Adults And High School Seniors 
Conservation Banquet March 7 

Cross Timbers 
Crisis Center To 
Begin Training 

CHILD ABUSE 
:24 HOUR HOTLINE 

1-800-252-5400 State Representative 
John Cook, 64th District, 
from Breckenridge, will 
be speaker at the Annual 
Meeting and Banquet of 

Legal Notice) 

Ranger Jr. College is 
inviting high school sen-
iors and adults who are 
not currently enrolled at 
RJC to participate in the 
first Ranger Jr. College 
Scholarship "Shoot-Out" 
Contest. 

Eight scholarships will 
be awarded to the top two 
contestants in the follow-
ing categories: 

Automotive 
Micro Computers 
Secretarial/Office 

Occupations 
Welding 

These eight persons will 
have a choice of either a 
$900 Dorm Scholarship or 
a $400 Book Scholarship 
for the 92-93 school year. 
Two additional scholar-
ships will be awarded 
through a random draw-
ing at the awards presen-
tation. 

The contest will be held 

The Cross Timbers 
Crisis Center will begin 
training for new volun-
teers on March 5, 6, and 
7, 

If you are interested in 
volunteering in direct 
victim services or support 
services for our center, 
please call 965-5516 be-
fore March 6th. 

Our center serves vic-
tims of sexual assault, 
domestic violence, and 
child abuse in Erath 
County along with 7 ad-
joining counties. 24 hour 
helpline (817) 965-HELP 
(Call collect). 

on Saturday, February 29, 
1992 in the Ranger Jr. 
College Auditorium. The 
following will be the 
agenda for the morning: 

8:30 Registration 
Auditorium ' 

9:00 Orientation 
9:30 Testing 

10:30 Grading 
11:30 Awards 
Presentation 

Faculty, Counselors, 
and Financial Aid Advi-
sors will be present to 
answer any questions or 
give additional informa-
tion about RJC while stu-
dents are testing. 

Ranger Jr. College feels 
that this is an excellent 
opportunity to help people 
be able to attend college. 

For more information 
call RangerJr. CollegeVo-
Tech Department at 647-
3234 (ext. 129). 

READ THE 
CLASSIFIEDS 

the Leon-Bosque Re-
source Conservation and 
Development area on 
Saturday, March 7, 1992 
at 6:30 p.m. at the Holi-
day Inn in Stephenville. 

Representative Cook 
serves as a member of 
the Energy Committee 
and the Criminal Juris-
prudence Committee in 

the House of Representa-
tives. 

Representative Cook 
served as a member of the 
Energy 	Committee 
Budget and Oversight 
Committee and chaired 
the Criminal Jurispru-
dence Subcommittee on 
DWI Law Revision. He is 
also a member of the 
Southern Legislative 
Conference Energy Com-
mittee. 

The public is invited to 
attend. Information about 
reservations and the 
meeting can be obtained 
from the Soil Conserva-
tion Service Office in 
Albany, Baird, Brecken-
ridge, Brownwood, Co- 
manche, 	Dublin, 
Eastland, Hamilton, Glen 
Rose, Goldthwaite, Me-
ridian and Stephenville. 

MAYNARD REAL ESTATE 
629-8568 Maynard Building, Hwy 80 East, Eastland, Texas 

WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS!! 	 Available Nights and Weekends Eastland Telegram, Cisco Press, 
Ranger Times, The Rising Star 
Thursday, February 27,1992 

On March 10 you have a choice 

ELECT 

JUNE HICKS 
EASTLAND COUNTY 

DEMOCRATIC CHAIRMAN 
Pd Pol. Adv. by June Hicks, Cisco, Texas, 

LEGAL NOTICE- 
Eastland Independent 

School District is accept-
ing bids for 100 24" stu-
dent desks, 65 13" chairs, 
100 14" chairs, and 40 16" 
chairs to be purchased by 
the school. For specifica-
tions contact Keith Wat-
kins, Superintendent, 
Eastland ISD, 900 W. 
Plummer, P.O. Box 31, 
Eastland, TX 76448. (817) 
629-8221. 

Bids should be mailed 
to Keith Watkins, Super-
intendent, Eastland ISD, 

a  900W. Plummer, P.O. Box 
up 31, Eastland, TX 76448. 

FAX #(817) 629-3677. 
Bids should be sealed with 
the statement "Student 
Desk Bid Enclosed" 
clearly visible on the out-
side of the envelope. Dead-
line to receive bids is 3:00 
p.m., Monday, March 9, 
1992. 

Bids will be opened for 
consideration Monday, 
March 9, 1992, at 3:30 
p.m., in the Eastland ISD 
Administration Office, 
900 W. Plummer, 
Eastland. Eastland ISD 
reserves the right to ac-
cept or reject any or all 
bids. 

(2-23, 2-27, 3-1, 3-4) 



MAJESTIC THEATRE 
629-1322 

Fri. • Sat. • Sun. • Mon. 
All Shows: 7:30 p.m. - '3.60  

629-1322 

MAJESTIC THEATR  

Computer Control & 
Ignition Analysis 

State Inspection Station 
Eastland 

Owner 
Blake Gaines 

629-1008 

DON'T OVERLOOK 

YOUR INSURANCE NEEDS 

Serving Eastland County Since 1919 

CONTACT 
D.L. KINNAIRD 

GENERAL INSURANCE 
629-2544 	 629-8606 

Sallie  Kinnaird  104 IcL T  'Amar Mike Perry 

Gaines Automotive 
Hi Tech Care For Hi Tech Cars 

Hours: Mon.-Fri. 
8:00 till 5:30 

Sat. 8:00 till Noon 

314 W. Main 

Buddy Aaron 
Managing General Agent 

108 S. Seaman 
P. 0. Box 392 

Eastland, Texas 76448 
Business (817) 629-8533 

Home (817) 629-1086 

ATTENTION: All who are concerned with 
C.D.s, IRAs, Annuities, even 

Roll-Over IRAs 
NOW'S THE TIME TO CONSIDER 

GUARANTEED 7.75% ANNUAL 
RATE ANNUITIES 

(7.49% monthly on $5,000.00 to $500,000.00) 

Can leave interest in at the end of the year 
and it will be tax deferred 

IT'LL PAY TO TALK TO BUDDY 
AS SOON AS POSSIBLE. 
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YARM  & kliv 

301 N. Seaman 

Eastland, Texas 76448 

(817) 629-2173 or 629-8035 	• 

Offering You Only the Best 
Feed - Seed - Vet. Supplies - Liquid Feed - Pet Supplies 

Lawn & Garden - Herbicides - Insecticides 
Dry Fertilizer - Liquid Fertilizer - Custom Application 
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A-1 BUILDERS 
Building & Remodeling 

- ROOFING 
- SIDING 
- METAL BUILDINGS 
- PLUMBING 
- ELECTRICAL 
- CONCRETE 

Commercial * Residential 
Jerry Maston • Owner 629-8148 	5-104 

The Making Of 
A  Missionary 

By Richard Kurklin 
After going to Belize last 

June, I felt that the Lord 
wanted me to make an-
other trip to the English 
speaking Central Ameri-
can country this winter, 
and that it was very im-
portant that I go. And 
since the Lord does not 
call without providing a 
way, the needed money 

,for airfare and expenses 
was given to me by Chris-
tian brothers and sisters. 

One of my objectives 
was to get acquainted with 
or become familiar with 
this third world country 
of about 180 thousand 
people. This objective was 
accomplished as I trav-
eled to every town in the 
country, except one in the 
northernmost district of 
the independent nation. I 
got to know the Southern 
Baptist missionaries in 
the country and became 
friends with those whom 
I worked. I also became 
friends with a number of 
national pastors and 
church leaders. I now feel 
completely athome in the 
country rather than like a 
foreigner. And I have 
learned to love the people 

This knowledge of the 
country, its people, and 
its needs should also en-
able me to be able to lead 
teams of volunteer mis-
sionaries into the coun-
try for short trips. The 
Christians of Belize need 
the help of such teams as 
churches are established 
and buildings are built. 
The nationals are often 
poor and lacking in skills, 
but work hard when given 
some guidance and help. 

As I prepared to leave 
Tyler with a medical team 
that included 3 doctors 
and an evangelist, the flu 
struck. Fourteen of us 
arrived at our destination 
ofBig Falls, a village near 
Punta Gorda in the south-
ernmost part of the coun-
try, with only one doctor 
and no preacher. I started 
to get suspicious about 
what God had in mind. I 
also had a problem with 
my return ticket that left 
a question about my abil-
ity to return, but the Lord 
took care of it while I was 
in Belize. All I had to do 
was to trust Him. 

After traveling for 
hundreds ofmiles in badly 
worn school type buses 
over some of the muddi-
est and roughest one lane 
roads in the world. we  

ended up staying in a 
house on top of a hill. It 
was awesomely beautiful 
as we looked out over the 
jungle and at the moun-
tains in the distance. But 
since the neighbors had 
been using the house for a 
chicken house, it was not 
clean and the floors were 
hard to sleep on. An 
American family living in 
Belize helped us prepare 
meals, often from native 
plants. 

A medical clinic we 
operated treated more 
than 180 sick people, 
Some of the people only 
spoke Indian languages or 
Spanish, but we managed 
to find translators and the 
doctor, a young lady, also 
spoke Spanish. The people 
could not afford the ex-
pense required to travel 
to a hospital, and some 
were very serious cases. 

We divided up and held 
two Vacation Bible 
Schools at the same time 
with more than 75 chil-
dren in each. one was in 
the Community Center 
and one was in the Naza-
rene Church. The Baptist 
Church there is quite 
small. 

But we had services 
each night in the Baptist 
church, and guess who 
started 	preaching? 
Candles were used for 
light at the night serv-
ices and I used a flash-
light to read my small 
bible. The people like to 
sing but rarely have a 
musical instrument. 

Finishing the project at 
Big Falls, we went to 
Punta Gorda for New 
Year's Day. Taking a long 
boat ride to Snake Key, a 
small jungle island with 
a beach, we went swim-
ming. We waded around 
the island looking for sea 
shells and found a large 
quantity ofcocaine, which 
we destroyed. We stayed 
in a hotel before taking 
the long bus ride back 
north. 

Finding something to 
eat and drink was a prob-
lem since everything 
closes on holidays and 
Sundays. A preacher from 
Louisiana was holding 
revival services at the 
Baptist church in Punta 
Gorda. 

I left the team at 
Belmopan as they re-
turned to Texas. I did not 
know what to expect, but 
I knew that I was doing 
what God wanted me to  

do. Cliff Scarbrough and 
Otis Brady are the two 
ranking missionaries who 
direct the Baptist work in 
Belize. I hadn't met Cliff 
but I had talked with him 
on the telephone, and I 
knew the way to his house. 
Cliff and Bettie, his wife, 
welcomed and fed me. We 
soon became acquanted 
and "hit it off well" to-
gether. Cliff explained 
that they were to start 
building a retreat center 
or church camp, and that 
my contribution to the 
effort was needed. 

We cleared jungle with 
machetes on five acres of 
land near the village of 
Camelote. it rained almost 
daily and the mud is ex-
tremely sticky. Though 
cool at night, it gets warm 
and humid in the day. Fast 
breathing is the only way 
to cool down as sweating 
does no good. And there 
were rocks and boulders 
to be moved as we horse-
shoed a road through the 
property. We had a small 
tractor with a plow and 
blade. The rocks had to be 
moved and the' road 
graded so that the rain-
water would drain off. I 
was amazed that such 
rocky ground could grow 
so much jungles. 

I was provided a rent 
house and a travel trailer 
to live in. Vehicles are very 
expensive and difficult to 
maintain in Belize and 
transportation is often a 
problem. But deciding 
that they could trust me 
and depend on me, I was 
provided a pickup to drive. 
I would carry national 
preachers to churches on 
Sunday to preach. I would 
encourage them and of-
ten teach the Sunday 
School lesson at the 
church. 

One Friday I packed a 

duffle bag back pack and 
caught a bus back down 
south to the Indian vil-
lages. We had worked 
with the Indians in June 
and we learned to love 
them, especially the chil-
dren, who nicknamed me 
Gringo. I wondered how 
I would be accepted this 
time and if the children 
would rem ember me. i was 
prepared for the worst. 
But I couldn't have been 
accepted any better. 

The people invited me 
into their homes, called 
me "brother" and insisted 
that I eat with them. the 
children were not around 
when I walked into the 
small village store. One of 
the girls walked in and 
seeing me shouted 
"Gringo" and ran to hug 
me. The other children 
reacted the same way. 
The boys wanted me to 
be with them and the 
girls had to hug me. there 
were comments from the 
men about how much the 
children love me, and it 
became evident to all. 

British soldiers help 
defend the small country 
and some were camped 
nearby. They seemed to 
wonder why the children 
love and trust me so 
much. I told them that I 
was a Baptist mission-
ary. And anytime the 
girls got a little scared, 
they would run to me. 

The Indians shared 
with me about their cul-
ture arid prospects for the 
future. The government 
has plans to eventually 
extend electric lines to 
even the jungle villages. 
Children were already 
watching cartoons on a 
small battery powered 
television set. The Indi-
ans were getting deeds to 
their land and learning to 
farm, and the T.V. will  

soon erode their culture. 
The Christian boys in 

the village shared with me 
one night, and I was proud 
ofthe boys who were saved 
during our June visit to 
the village. They were 
being Christian examples 
to others in the area. 

Living in dirt floored, 
thatched roofed homes 
made of poles, the Indi-
ans eat animals killed in 
the jungle along with 
beans, rice and corn. And 
there is always fresh fruit. 
Pigs and chickens are also 
kept. 

I felt honored to get to 
preach both the morning 
and evening services at 
the village church. But all 
too soon it was time for 
me to return to Belmopan. 
And I couldn't hold back 
the tears as I had to say 
"bye" to the children and 
catch a bus. 

Back at the retreat 
center, we built the first 
structure and it was 
named in my honor. It 
was the Richard Kurklin 
Memorial Outhouse, and 
it had Mahogany rafters. 
It was also quite essen-
tial. As you can see, we 
were having fun. a house 
for a caretaker is now 
under construction and a 
small hotel building will 
be next. It can house 
mission teams from the 
United States, and a camp 
staff during camp ses-
sions. A kitchen/dinning 
hall, worship shelter, and 
two dorms for the chil-
dren or young people will 
be added as money and 
labor are donated. 

I went to the airport to 
meet another mission 

team which was arriv-
ing. I was to work with 
them during my last week 
in Belize, and return to 
Tyler, Texas with them. 
We went back down south 
to a beautiful fruit grow-
ing mountain valley on the 
Hummingbird Highway. 
With a singles team offour 
men and two women, our 
task seemed impossible. 
The framework of the 
village's combination 
church, school, and storm 
shelter had been eaten 
up by termites and the 
roof was in danger of fall-
ing in. The church mem-
bers had purchased 
lumber, but they just did 
have the skills to make 
the repairs. We had four 
days to get the job done 
while the women attended 
to villagers who needed 
medical care. One of the 
church ladies cooked for 
us and we slept in the 
homes of villagers. After 
working each day , we 
would bathe in the creek, 
then conduct nightly 
revival services. We often 
walked for milesbetween 
the church and homes, 
sometimes accompanied 
by children.And we 
quickly became friends 
with the people. With the 
help of God and an "Ag-
gie" engineer, we were 
able to jack up the lioof 
intact, then replace the 
rafters and framework 
under it. We not only 
repaired the building, but 
made it much stronger. 
And it only took three and 
one half days. We also had 
fun teasing with our 
"Aggie", who was a good 
sport and encouraged the  

fun. We were able to visit 
the area's town that last 
afternoon before return- 
ing north to Belize City. 

A mattress and some 
bedding were given to the 
Christian mother ofeight- 
een children. Their un-
Christian father had 
abandoned them, taking 
everything with him. 
They had only boards to 
sleep on and their in- 
come from washing 
clothes would barely buy 
food. Bedding is expen- 
sive there but the lady 
wanted to wash our 
clothes for free. We had a 
better idea, and they 
hugged us with tears in 
there eyes. 

As we waited for the 
bus, a crowd of villagers 
gathered, and they all 
hugged us before we left. 
We had saved their 
church, and we had come 
to love each other. 

We attended church 
services and ate in Belize 
City and took a shopping 
trip to the resort town of 
San Pedro. Spending the 
last night in a hotel, we 
flew back to Texas. 

Now that God has 
trained me, I wonder how 
soon I will return to Be-
lize and if I will be able to 
take a volunteer mission 
team from this area. I feel 
that I am to get a job for 
now and wait for God to 
work out the future. The 
missionaries say that 
they would like for me to  

work with them full time 
in Belize, but living there 
is expensive and no sup-
port money is available. 
They also say that it would 
be better if I were mar-
ried. 

I feel that God eventu-
ally wants me to work full 
time in Belize. That seems 
like an impossibility at 
the present, but if that is 
God's will, He will make a 
way. He continues to 
answer prayers, work 
miracles, and He enables 
me to do what He asks of 
me. I have seen Him do so 
many wonderful things, 
and since He loves us, He 
will do even more. There 
is nothing more fun than 
serving Jesus Christ, and 
I can hardly wait to see 
what He will do next. And 
since I am a Christian, I 
have Christian brothers 
and sisters among the 
various countries and 
races of people, and we 
share the love of Jesus. 

(Note: Richard Kurklin 
maybe contacted through 
the Calvary Baptism 
Church in Cisco.) 

READ THE 
CLASSIFIEDS 

A Gift to the 
AMERICAN CANCER SOCIETY 

siMEMORIAL  
PROGRAM 

means so much In cancer control 

1-800-ACS-2345 

Accepted 

Eastland Telegram, Cisco Press, 
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109 W. Main 
Eastland, TX 76448 

817-629-3481 

Spring Marling Sate 
ALL Antiques 

DrasticatLy Reduced 
Prices Good 'Through 

February 29, 1992 
L 

$.0 JJfe, Xa-6 
— -117: 

629-3433 
605 W. Main 
Eastland, TX 

Air 
Open Mon.-Fr. 9:00 - 6:00 

Sat. 1:00-4:00 
Closed Wednesdays 

Haircuts • Permanents • 
Socolor • Manicures Nail Art • 

Shampoo-Sets • Sculptured Nails 

Kara Ford Owner/Operator 
Walk-Ins We/come 

5-19 

..-mvalen:aliff1•11111=111111111MMII, 	 

Basic dog obedience 
classes at Eastland Co. 
Livestock Raisers Barn. 
Registration Monday, 	of 
Mar. 2nd, 6:30 p.m., 
12 weeks $50.00 
For Information Call 915-672-4546 

5-18 

Red Barn Cafe 
in Putnam 

Welcomes you all to try our new hours 

Friday 10 a.m. - 9 p.m. 

3 21 

Mon.-Thurs & Sat. 10 a.m. - 2 p.m. Fri. 10 a.m. - 9 p.m. 
L

Catfish Special  
5 p.m. to 9 p.m. 

lders 
Keepers 

I I  ANTIQUES  

i 

Ityf..nt5 14 13 yrA 

81 Chevy Luv Pickup, 	89 Escort, 4 spd., 
5 sp., deisel 	$2550 w/air, nice car 	$3495 

88 Chevy Celebrity Wagon, 
extra clean, fully loaded, auto, 
air 	 $4550 

83 Oldsmobile, Delta 88 Royale 
Brougham, 4 dr., auto, air, 
extra clean car 	$2250 

85 Plymouth Reliant 	89 Tempo, 35000 miles, 
Auto, Air 	 $1500 Red, 2 dr 	 $4650 

1989 Dodge Caravan 	$5995 89 Tempo blue, low miles, 2 dr, 
5 sp., 35,000 miles 	$4450 

1987 Dodge Caravan 	$4950 	 :SPECIAL  
89 Escort Wagon, 

1989 Dodge Dynasty LE Auto low mileage 	 $4450 
Air, Cruise, Tilt, AM/FM, 
1 owner 	 $5250 88 Ford Aerostar Van, 

Fully Loaded w/Seats, 
1990 Dodge Dynasty LE AM/ 5 Sp 	 $4950 
FM Cassette, Cruise, Tilt, Elect 
Locks, 1 Owner..$5995 	88 Ford Tempo, Auto, 

Air, AM/FM, 60,000 miles, 
Brand New 1990 Buick Cen- 1 owner, Extra nice car 	$3750 
fury, Auto, Air, Cruise, Tilt, 
AM/FM cassette, 1 owner, V6 84 Ford Deisel Auto, Air 	S3250 
engine, extra nice 	$7750 

83 Chevy Short Narrow 
Bed Pickup, 4 wheel 
drive,Auto 	 82995 

89 Ford Tempo 4 dr., Auto, Air, 
Cruise, Tilt, AM/FM, 1 Owner, 
45,000 actual miles New 
tires 	 $4200 

1989 Dodge Spirit 4 Dr, Auto, 1981 Chevy Blazer 	$2650 
Air, Cruise, Real nice car.$4 750 

1990 Ram Van, FL50 Good 
1987 Escort 5 sp. w/air..S1950 Times, Auto, Air, Fully 

loaded 	 $7950 

Other Cars To Choose From 
5-104 

1989 Chevy Cavalier, 4 Dr, 
auto & air 	 $3350 

1-20 MOTORS 
19th & 1-20 
Cisco,Texas 

(817) 442-4262 or 442-2161 

FRONT ENGINE RIDER 

$79999  
• 12.0 H.P. front engine rider 
(Cast iron sleeves) 
• 38" deck (catcher capable) 

93-7120-4 

FRONT TILLER 

$29999  

• 5 H.P. Briggs & 
Stratton engine 

• Sealed chain drive 
• 26" tiller width, 13" 
• 8" steel wheels 
• Steel channel handle 

94-2002-7 

REAR TILLER 

$59999  
• 5 H.P. Briggs & 

Stratton engine 
• CRT 
• 17" tiller width, 12" 

diameter 
• 16x4 pneumatic 
wheels w/lug tread 

• 3 qt. gas tank 
• Grip on handle 
• 2 year warranty 
• Tine shield w/ad-

Justable side 
panels 

94-3209-7 

20" DLX MULCHER 

$19999  
• 5.0 Quantum Engine • Foam grip 
• Throttle on handle 	• Height adjuster 
• 8" Steel wheels w/ • 2 year mower 
hub cap 
	 warranty 

93-5156-0 

Sanders Tires and Towing 
24 Hour Towing Service - We Don't Want An Arm and a Leg, Just Your 'Tow" 

Farm, Fleet & Domestic Tire Service - We Come To You 
900 Conrad Hilton 
	

Cisco, TX 
	

442-2829 Days, 442-1500 Nights 	 5-15 

ELEVENTH 
COURT OF APPEALS 

The following proceed-
ings were had in the Court 
of Appeals, Eleventh Dis-
trict of Texas: 

AFFIRMED 
11-90-243-CV In re: 

A.J., L.J., & L.L.J., chil-
dren-Taylor. (Opinion by 
Judge McCloud). 

11-91-015-CV In re: 
J.C.B., a child-Comanche. 
(Opinion by Judge 
McCloud). 

11-91-040-CR Sterling 
.Shelton Starks v. State of 

Texas.-Stonewall. (Opin-
ion by Judge Arnot). 

11-91-074-CR Terry 
Eugene Barney v. State of 
Texas.-Taylor. (Opinion 
by Judge Dickenson). 

11-91-181-CV C. E. 
Sewell and Big Country 
Pork Farm, Inc. v. Russell 
Williams.-Taylor. (Opin-
ion by Judge Arnot). 

FORMER OPINION 
'WITHDRAWN; 
AFFIRMED 
11-90-052-CR Louis 

William Alter, III v. State 
of Texas.-Harris. (Opin-
ion by Judge Arnot). 

MODIFIED & 
AFFIRMED 
11-91-172-CV Danny R. 

Peden v. Westgate Homes, 
Inc. and Tommy Curtis 
Hudson .-PaloPinto.  

(Opinion by Judge Dick-
enson). 

REVERSED & 
RENDERED 
11-91-043-CV Kenneth 

Sanders, Individually and 
d/b/a Kenneth Sanders 
Investments v. The 
Peoples State Bank, 
Clyde, Moran Branch, as 
successor in interest of 
Dam on 	Garvin.- 
Shakelford. (Opinion by 
Judge Arnot). 

MOTIONS 
SUBMI 	I 1ED 
& GRANTED 
11-91-108-CR Lloyd 

Mills, Sr. v. State of 
Texas.-Smith. State's 
fourth motion for exten-
sion of time to file brief. 

11-91-121-CR Brenda 
Darlene Williams v. State 
of 	Texas.-Smith. 
Appellant's motion to 
adopt co-defendant's brief. 

11-91-124-CR Ronald 
Brooks v. State of Texas.-
Smith. Appellant's second 
motion for extension of 
time to file brief. 

11-91-135-CR John 
Riley Bernard v. State of 
Texas.-PaloPinto. State's 
fourth motion for exten-
sion of time to file brief. 

11-91-137-CR Edith 
Gwen Atwood a/kia Edith  

Gwen Gill v. State of 
Texas.-Palo Pinto. State's 
fourth motion for exten-
sion of time to file brief. 

11-91-213-CR Jayson 
Croon v. State of Texas.-
Upshur. Appellant's sec-
ond motion for extension 
of time to file brief. 

11-91-214-CV Magda 
Luker v. Terri Luker.-
Shelby. Appellee's motion 
for extension of time to 
file brief: 

11-91-234-CR Bennie 
Grismore v. State of 
Texas.-Smith. Appellant's 
motion for extension of 
time to file brief. 

11-91-276-CR Alonzo 
Diego Fuller v. State of 
Texas.-Brown. 
Appellant's motion for 
extension of time to file 
record. 

11-92-013-CR Timothy 
Dale McFarland v. State 
of 	Texas.-Smith. 
Appellant's motion for 
extension of time to file 
statement of facts. 

11-92-014-CR Pamela 
Sue Tompkins v. State of  

Texas.-Smith. Appellant's 
motion for extension of 
time to file statement of 
facts. 

11-92-015-CR 
Ernestine Wickware v. 

State of Texas.-Smith. 
State's motion for exten-
sion of time to file state-
ment of facts. 

11-92-016-CV Jerry C. 
Scott v. D. Gamble.-Hous-
ton. Appellant's pro se 
motion for extension of 
time to file brief. 

MOTIONS 
SUBMI1 	1ED 
& OVERRULED 
11-90-052-CR Louis 

William Alter, III v. State 
of 	Texas.-Harris. 
Appellant's motion for 
rehearing. 

11-91-225-CV Alta J. 
Kilpatrick and George D. 
Kilpatrick v. Brookshire 
Brothers, Inc.-Cherokee. 
Appellee's motion to dis-
miss appeal. 

CASES SUBMITTED 
11-91-051-CV In the 

matter ofJ.W.N., a Child.-
Taylor. 

11-91-064-CV Wesley 
Adams and Susan Adams 
v. J. M. Hall.-PaloPinto. 

11-91-140-CR Sharlon 
Denise Williams v. State 
of Texas.-Baylor. 

11-91-201-CVThe State 

of Texas v. F/R Cattle 
Company, Inc.-Erath. 

11-91-203-CV Dan Tho-
mas v. Arlan Phil Larson.-
Anderson. 

11-91-204-CV Dan Tho-
mas v, Texas Department 
of Criminal Justice.-An-
derson. 

11-91-211-CV Dan Tho-
mas v. Cay Cannon.-An-
derson. 

11-91-212-CV Dan Tho-
mas v. Ann Conrad.-An-
derson. 

11-91-215-CV Dan Tho-
mas v. James Alford, 
Warden.-Anderson. 

11-91-216-CV Dan Tho-
mas v. Robert E. Cronk.-
Anderson. 

11-91-217-CV Dan Tho-
mas v. Steven Ilender-
son.-Anderson. 

11-91-269-CV D. H. 
Bashford v. Barbara J. 
Roper and W. F. (Bill) 
Roper.-Callahan. 

11-92-012-CV Dan Tho-
mas v. Jesse E. Powers, 
Lt. Steven Henderson, 
Sgt. John T. Riggle.-
Anderson. 

Cisco Press - Eastland 
Telegram - Ranger 
Times - Rising Star -
Callahan County Star 

Thursday, 
February 27, 1991 

BaSEWILLI 
card show 

(Featuring 
Nolan Ryan Cards) 

Saturday, 
March 7, 1992 
9 AM - 5 PM 

Budget Host Inn 
1-20 Exit 343 
Eastland, TX 

Come and Have Fun! 
Admission $1.00 
Hourly drawings 

for prizes 

Dealer Info. 
Charles Allen 

1-817-498-4865 5 ,, 

A DRUNK CAUSED IT AND A SEATBELT SAVED A LIFE -
The photo shows what was left of a pickup driven by Robert 
Steed after being hit at 70 mph by two men near Abilene last 
Friday night at approximately 10:30 p.m. Robert said that he 
was traveling North on 83-84 about one mile from Humana 
Hospital when the speeding vehicle driven by a man slammed 
into the passenger side of his small pickup causing him to roll 
3 times before landing in the median approximately 50 yards 
away. The driver never hit his brakes, a witness said. Robert 
had to be excavated from the vehicle by Fire & Rescue and 
was transported to Humana where he was treated and re-
leased. The other men were unharmed and the driver was 
taken into custody by Abilene Police. Robert said that he 
hoped young people would learn a few lessons from his crash. 
Robert said "You don't realize the violence of an accident like 
that. I am confident that my funeral service would be today if 
I hadn't been wearing my seat belt and except for the grace of 
God." Robert also noted that there is no excuse for drinking 
and driving. "Those two men will have this on their records 
and consciences for the rest of their lives. They could have 
had to deal with causing a wife and 3 small children to lose 
their husband and father," Robert said. 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • c • • • • • • • • • • • • • 
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1-800-252-5400 
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Pre-Season 
Lawn Mower 

And Tiller Sale 

Western Auto 
Associate Store • 
1201 Conrad Hilton Ave. 

Cisco 442-1460 
5-17 

• 
• 
• 

CHILD ABUSE 
:24 HOUR HOTLINE 

• 
• 
• 

No payments plus 
no interest up to 6 

months. 
Total charge 

w/approved credit. 
Details in store 
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County Livestock Show Winners Of Eastland Fast Talk 
by Cheryl Robinette 

..Wildcat Tales 
Journalism Class 

Rising Star High School 
Junior Cat Tracks 

The junior Cats have been 
very busy this week preparing 
for the upcoming track sea-
son. The guys believe that they 
will do well and with the eighth 
graders leading the way, they 
are off to a great start. 

This year the Cats will par- 

by Christy Hughes 

ticipate in five track meets. 
The first is on March 13 at 
Cross Plains, followed by 
Baird, March 21; Rising Star, 
March 27; Panther Creek, April 
14; and the district meet at 
Rising Star on April 23. 

Stuteville's Stats 
The Lady Cats are now 

excitedly preparing for track. 
Every afternoon you can find 
them working diligently to 
perfect their individual events. 

Participating in track are 
Tianay Chambers, Samantha 
Kerr, Amy Collins, Angelia De-
Long, Tiesha Long, Melody 
Fisher, Robin Griffin, Amy 

by Emily StutevIlle 

Larance, and Kristie Collins. 
Coach Stuteville says, 

"They work very hard and I'm 
sure we'll do well at all of our 
meets." 

If the junior Lady Cats can 
continue to have such great 
attitudes, it is definite that they 
will have great success. 

Wid's Wide World of Wildcats 
by Wid Keeling 

February 18 the Wildcats 
traveled to Santa Anna to play 
Lohn for the district champi-
onship. 

The Cats were hurt by turn-
overs. Lohn scored off these 
turnovers but had a hard time 
setting uptheir offense thanks 
to the Wildcats mighty de-
fense. 

Scoring for the Wildcats 
were Mackey Elliott 3, Chad 
Hill 13, Jarod Horton 6, Jason 
Bible 4, Wid Keeling 4, and 
Donnie Horton 2. 

The Cats will now play 
Huckabay for bi-district cham-
pionship. Be sure to come out 
and support the Wildcats. 

Lady Cat Athletics 
by Gherda Williams 

MARKET STEERS 
Cross Bred Heavy 

Grand Champion-Mor-
gan Moylan, Eastland. 

Cross Bred Light 
Reserve Grand Cham-

pion-Shelly Crocker, 
Cisco; 2. Donny Choate, 
Cisco. 

MEAT GOATS 
Heavy Weight 

Grand Champion-
Lyndee Groce, Eastland; 
Reserve Grand Cham-
pion-Karl Winge, Nim-
rod. 

Light Weight 
1. Trisha Hutchens, 

Nimrod; 2. Barbie But-
ler, Eastland; 3. Shayla 
Riehle, Ranger. 

ANGORA GOATS 

Kid Doe 
1. Kelli Crozier, Nim-

rod 4-H; 2. Tim Th-
ompson, Cisco FFA; 3. 
Tim Thompson, Cisco 
FFA. 

Kid Buck 
1. Bonnie Crozier, 

Nimrod 4-H; 2. Billy Croz-
ier, Nimrod 4-H; 3. Kelli 
Crozer, Nimrod 4-H. 

Adult Doe 
lmteff 

FFA; 2. Kelli Crozier, 
NiodRu 

4-H; 3. 

Ranger3.Todd  

Cantwell, Ranger FFA. 
Adult Buck 

1. Billy Crozier, Nim-
rod 4-H; 2. Bonnie Croz-
ier, Nimrod 4-H; 3. Tim 
Thompson, Cisco FFA. 

Since the Lady Cat basket-
ball team finished up their 
season a few weeks ago with 
a record of 3-4, practices for 
all of the spring sports have 
begun. 

The track girls have been 
diligently working out every-
day since the beginning of last 
week. They alternately work 
on running events and field 
events along with minimal 
weight training for strength to 
prepare themselves ior the first 

Cosmetology Students 

What sophomore guy ran 
into another sophomore's car? 
Do we need to re-elect worst 
drivers? 

What two freshmen girls got 
into trouble when their par-
ents were listening to their 
phone conversations about a 
certain boy? 

What sophomore knows a 
new use for wheel borrows? 
Think she'll tell everyone? 

What three seniors went 
hunting over the weekend? 
Everything was cozy until it 
started raining. 

What senior got chased by 
a skunk? You know, it couldn't 
do that if you would kill it with 
the first shot. 

What senior, freshmen, and 
sophomore went camping in 
the rain? Most people know 
enough to get out of the rain, 

not STAY in it. 
What two sophomore girls 

had a fight over the almonds 
in a chocolate bar? 

What senior girl just isn't 
ready for Mondays? Could that 
be why she never shows up at 
8 a.m. 

What senior guy is really 
gross smelling on Monday 
morning? 

What freshman girl calls a 
certain sophomore guy way to 
late at night? Doesn't she know 
some parents get REAL up-
set? 

What first period class is 
really sleepy-eyed? Wake up, 
PAL time in Home Ec. 

What sophomore g irl started 
to paint her room and got more 
paint on her legs than she did 
on her walls? 

What senior guy got a "half-
way" haircut? The top is long, 
the rest is almost shaved. 

Who went coyote hunting? 
Yea sure! Do your parents 
know what you were really 
doing? 

Wildcats eyes to: 
The basketball guys for still 

being in the playoffs. 
Mrs. W. and Mrs. I. for help-

ing the elementary kids in the 
P.A.L. program. 

C.H. and S.W. for keeping 
the uniforms clean and spiffy. 

Spring Fashion 
Show at CJC 

BROILERS 
Grand Champion-

Adam Torrez, Gorman; 
Reserve Grand Cham-
pion-Shane Caraway, 
Gorman; 3. Scott Scitern, 
Gorman. 

MARKET HOGS 
Berkshire Heavy 

1. John Mark Stephens, 
Gorman; 2. Janice Glover, 
Gorman. 

Berkshire Light 
1. Samantha Stephens, 

Gorman; 2. Reese Clark, 
Gorman. 

Chester White 
Heavy 

Breed Reserve Cham-
pion-Todd Cantwell, 
Ranger; 2. Mandy Cun-
ningham, Ranger; 3. 
Shawn Harrelson, Rising 
Star. 

Chester White Light 
Showmanship-Donald 

Majors, Gorman; 2. Eric 
Herrera, Eastland; 3. 
Ryan Holt, Eastland. 

Chester White 
Medium 

1. Chris Herrera, 
Eastland; 2. Bradley Paul 
Fleming, Cisco; 3. Tye 
Hart, Olden. 

Cross Bred Heavy 
Grand Champion-

Shane Caraway, Gorman; 
2. Blair Bailey, Rising 
Star; 3. Ginger Cantwell, 
Ranger. 

Cross Bred Light 
1. BrentShepard, Cisco; 

2. Carrie Kerrie, Cisco; 3. 
Robbi 	Daskevich, 
Eastland. 

Cross Bred Medium 
Breed Reserve Cham-

pion-Robbie Speegle, 
Cisco; 2. Shannon 
Mauney, Gorman; 3. 
Chad Cannistraci, Cisco. 

Cross Bred Medium 
Heavy 

1. Jeff Harris, Rising 
Star; 1. Kenneth Rainey, 
Gorman; 2. Becca 
Carlton, Eastland. 

Incredible 
Edibles 

track meet of the season on 
March 7, less than two weeks 
away. 

Other spring sports like 
tennis and golf already have 
some scheduled tournaments 
and the Lady Cat athletes in-
terested in these sports have 
had meetings to plan prac-
tices several times since the 
beginning of the spring sports 
season. 

All of the Lady Cat spring 
athletes hope to do well this 
season and have been prac-
ticing hard to achieve this goal. 
Please get out and support 
them, the weather should be 
great by then!! 

by Inga Williams Letter to the Editor 
Dear Marie 

project. 
Entertainment will be 

presented by the Wran-
gler Belles, under the 
supervision ofMs. Debbie 
Baker. Other special tal-
ents will also be presented 
during the program. 

Master of Ceremonies 
will be Mrs. Elaine 
Willingham of Abilene, 
and student Instructor of 
Cosmetology. 

Cosmetology students 
will be under the supervi-
sion of Ms. Dessie Cov-
ington, instructor of the 
department and Mrs. 
Elaine Willingham, stu-
dent instructor and Lone 
Star Stylist with the Na-
tional Cosmetology Asso-
ciation. 

The public is invited to 
come and enjoy an eve-
ning of fun and entertain-
ment. 

Nothing starts the sea-
son off like a colorful and 
informative fashion show. 
So, on March 5 at 7 p.m. in 
the auditorium of Cisco-
Junior College, the stu-
dents of the cosmetology 
department will present 
a fashion show featuring 
the newest total look in 
hair cuts, hair designs, 
make-up and hair orna-
ments, and the latest look 
in spring fashions. 

The students are spon-
sored by local merchants 
as well as merchants in 
surrounding areas. 

Hair extensions will be 
the newest service to the 
public. 

Donations will be ac-
cepted at the door and 
distributed through Cisco 
Junior College with pro-
ceeds goingto a charitable 

1. Mandy Cunningham, 
Ranger; 2. Kori Cooper, 
Eastland; 3. Brandon 
Wilson, Eastland. 

Fine Wool Cross 
Medium 

Breed Reserve Cham- 
pion-Todd Cantwell, 
Ranger; 2. Kirby Bush, 
Rising Star; 3. Bryan 
Kitchens, Eastland. 

Medium Wool 
Heavy 

Grand Champion-Gin-
ger Cantwell, Ranger; 2. 
Brian Perry, Eastland; 3. 
Kristen Stroebel, Cisco. 

Medium Wool Light 
1. John Paul Wesley, 

Ranger; 2. Tracie Ingram, 
Cisco; 3. Cari Daniels, 
Gorman. 

Medium Wool Light 
Heavy 

1. Ashley Laminack, 
Gorman; 3. Rebecca 
Massingill, Eastland; 4. 
Ashley Reich, Gorman. 

Medium Wool 
Medium 

Reserve Grand Cham-
pion-Tiffany Sedillo, 
Eastland; 3. Lynsey Cun-
ningham, Ranger; 4. Scott 
Scitern, Gorman. 

Southdown Heavy 
Showmanship-Joanna 

Wallace, Ranger; Breed 
Reserve Champion- 
James 	Hamilton, 
Eastland; 3. Christy 
Monsey, Eastland. 

Southdown Light 
1. Clayton Cantwell, 

Ranger; 2. Camille Pharr, 
Cisco; 4. Brad Robinson, 
Ranger. 

Southdown Cross 
Medium 

Showman ship-Shila 
Creacy, Nimrod; Breed 
Reserve Champion-Mi-
chael Rabb. 

MARKET RABBIT 
White 

Grand Champion-
Joanna Wallace, Ranger; 
Reserve Champion-
Miriam Nicks, Cisco; 3. 
Shayla Riehle, Ranger. 

Duroc Heavy 
Breed Reserve Cham-

pion-Levi Roberts, Gor-
man; 2. Cole Sandlin, 
Gorman; 3. Cody Butler, 
Olden. 

Duroc Light 
1. Clay Sandlin, Gor-

man; 2. Jamie Salway, 
Nimrod; 3. Aaron Ken-
nedy, Eastland. 

Duroc Medium 
Showmanship-Matt 

Schaefer, Cisco; 2. 
Heather Sandlin, Gor-
man; 3. J. J. Clark, Gor-
man. 

Hampshire Heavy 
1. Kris Scitern, Gor-

man; 4. Blake Guthrey, 
Gorman; 5. Kristen Stroe-
bel, Cisco. 

Hampshire Light 
1. Amanda Cearley, 

Cisco; 2. Christina 
Mauney, Gorman; 4. Don 
Mauney, Gorman. 

Hampshire Medium 
Reserve Grand Cham-

pion-Shane Caraway; 1. 
Ashley Reich, Gorman; 4. 
Marla Smith, Gorman. 

Hampshire Medium 
Heavy 

Breed Reserve Cham-
pion-Lynsey Cunning-
ham, Ranger; 2. Heather 
Duncan, Cisco; 3. Terry 
Ware, Rising Star. 

Spotted Poland 
Heavy 

1. Judi Ware, Rising 
Star; 2. Mauchey Doug 
Elliott, Rising Star; 3. 
Tessie Ingram, Cisco. 

Spotted Poland 
Light 

1. Samantha Stephens, 
Gorman; 2. Tracie 
Crocker, Cisco; 3. Diana 
Glover, Gorman. 

Yorkshire Heavy 
Showmanship-Rebecca 

Coleman; 3. Holly Green-
wood, Ranger; 5. Jeremy 
Orsagh, Olden. 

Yorkshire Light 
Breed Reserve Cham-

pion-Ashley Laminack, 
Gorman; 2. Jason War-
ren, Gorman; 3. Skye 
Richey, Olden. 

MARKET LAMBS 
Fine Wool Heavy 

Breed Reserve Cham-
pion-Robbie Speegle, 

Cisco; 2. Laurah Johnson, 
Eastland; 3. Don Mauney, 
Gorman. 

Fine Wool Light 
Showmanship-Dylan 

Bowles, Eastland; 2. 
Tommy Thompson, Cisco; 
3. Brendan Odom, Cisco. 

Fine Wool Cross 
Heavy 

Showmanship-Tommy 
Seay; 2. Melanie Griffin, 
Eastland; 3. Timothy 
Thompson. 

Fine Wool Cross 
Light 

What a pleasant two 
days we experienced with 
Rising Star's students! 
The gifted / talented stu-
dents in the Rising Star 
middle and high schools 
attended the WINGS 
Student Seminars at 
Region 14 Education 
Service Center in Abilene 
on Tuesday and Wednes-
day, February 11 and12. 
The students from Rising 

I'm a senior and as far as 
college goes, things are look-
ing pretty bleak. I have no 
funding and my parents can't 
pay for it. What can I do? 

Dead Broke 
Dear Broke, 
Get with your school coun-

selor and apply for financial 
aid. There is money in pro-
grams that doesn't get used 
because most students won't 
go out and look for it. No one 
will hand it to you. If you are 
serious, get busy. 

February 24-28 
MON: Lunch: Burritos, salad, 
crackers,fruit, milk. Breakfast: 
Scrambled egg, toast, juice 
milk. 
TUE: Lunch: 	Steak, pota- 
toes, green beans, rolls, jello, 
milk. Breakfast: Biscuits, juice, 
milk. 
WED: Lunch: Beans, potato 
cubes, coleslaw, cornbread, 
cobbler, milk. Breakfast: Ba-
con, toast, juice, milk. 
THU: Lunch: Chicken strips, 
mashed potatoes, corn, rolls, 
pudding, milk. breakfast: 
Pancakes, juice, milk 
Fill: Lunch: Chili dogs, fix-
ings. French fries, cookies, 
milk. breakfast: 	Sausage 
gravy, biscuits, juice, milk 

This page is made possible 
by the businessses below. 

Star school were most 
courteous and attentive 
while actively participat-
ing with presenters who 
had given their time and 
expertise. It is always a 
pleasure to see young 
people who value learn-
ing and guidance. Be sure 
to express to these stu-
dents and their teachers 
your esteem for their atti-
tudes and hard work. 

Sincerely, 
Cecelia Boswell 
Educational Consult-

ant, Gifted and Talented 
Education Service Cen-

ter, Region 14 
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DEMOCRATIC PARTY PRIMARY ELECTION (ELECCION PRIMARIA DEL PARTIDO DEMOCRATICO) 

(CONDADO DE) EASTLAND COUNTY, TEXAS 

MARCH 10, 1992 (10 DO MARZO 1992) 

Thursday, February 27, 1992 

Not to Be Used for Mail Yet 

Rurals Get New 911 Addresses 
SAMPLE BALLOT (BOLETA DE MUESTRA) 

INSTRUCTION NOTE: (NOTA DE INSTRUCCION:) 

Vote for the candidate of your choice in each race by placing an "X" in the square beside the candidate's name. (Vote por 
el candidate de su preferencia en cada carrera marcando con una "X" el cuadro al !ado del nombre del candidate.) 

"I am a Democrat and understand that I am ineligible to vote or participate in another political party's primary election or con-
vention during this voting year." (''Yo soy Democratico y comprendo que no estoy elegible pare voter o participar en la election 
primaria o la convention de atgun otro partido politico durante este ano electoral.") 

MEMBER, STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION, District 14 

(Miembro de la Junta Estate/ de Instruction Publics, 
Distrito Num. 14) 

113 William L. (Bill) Hudson 

TO THE PEOPLE OF 
RURAL EASTLAND COUNTY 

THIS IS AN OFFICIAL NOTICE OF YOUR 9 1 ADDRESS. 

1502 CR 180  

DO NOT USE THIS AS YOUR MAILING ADDRESS UNTIL 
NOTIFIED BY YOUR LOCAL POST OFFICE. 

ANY QUESTIONS SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO YOUR 
EASTLAND COUNTY COMMISSIONER. 

BLDG ID #: 	1 3Ca7  

STATE SENATOR, District 22 

(Senador Estatal, Distrito Num. 22) 

O Bob Glasgow 

PREFERENCE FOR PRESIDENTIAL NOMINEE 

(Preferencia pars un candidate nombrado pare presidents) 

You may vote for presidential candidate whose name ap-
pears on the ballot by placing an "X" in the square beside 
the candidate's name. (Usted puede voter por un candidate 
pare presidents cuyo nombre operate en la boleta par mar-
car con una "X" el cuadra al !ado del nombre del candidate.) 

❑ Bob Kerrey 

O George W. Benns 

O Tom Harkin 

O Edmund G. Brown, Jr. 

O J. Louis McAlpine 

D Lyndon H. La Rouche, Jr. 

D Paul E. Tsongas 

O Tod Howard Hawks 

O Rufus Higginbotham 

❑ Charles Woods 

❑ Bill Clinton 

The Postal Service is 
working with City lead- 
ers and the County Com-
missioners in an effort to 
make the address changes 
as smooth as possible. 

County Commissioners 
Richard Robinson (Pct. 1) 
and Calvin Ainsworth 
(Pct. 2) stated at the last 
Commissioners Court 
meeting that several 
roads in their Precincts 
have not been addressed. 

Jedco Designs of Clyde 
was hired by the County 
to number the rural roads 
and address rural dwell-
ings. 

activities in regard to the 
911 System. 

"Residents are re-
quested not of start using 
the 911 addresses until 
notified in newspapers 
and on the radio to make 
the change," Mrs. Roach 
says. 

She indicates that quite 
asbit of work is involved in 
the transition, and it will 
take some time. 

Other Postal Service 
officials in the county 
agree with her, saying 
that the changeover will 
take a group effort-and 
will need the people's 
cooperation. 

STATE REPRESENTATIVE, District 60 

(Representante Estatal, Distrito Num. 60) 

O John Cook 

More information was 
obtained from Venita 
Roach, Eastland Postmas-
ter, who is coordinating 
the County Postoffice 

JUSTICE, COURT OF APPEALS, 11th District 

(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones, Distrito Num. 11) 

O Bob Dickenson U.S. REPRESENTATIVE, District 17 
(Representante de los Estados Unidos, Distrito Num. 17) 

O Charles W Stenholm 

RAILROAD COMMISSIONER 

(Comisionado de Ferrocarriles) 

O Lena Guerrero 

O David Young 

DISTRICT JUDGE, 91st JUDICIAL DISTRICT 

(Juez del Distrito, Distrito Judicial Num. 91st) 

O Jim R. Wright 

JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, Place 1 
(Juez, Corte Suprema, Lugar Num. 1) 

Li Oscar H. Maury 

SHERIFF 
(Sherds) 

O Ben Sansillo 

O Randy J. Moncrief 

O Ronnie (R.B.) White 

JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, Place 2 

(Juez, Corte Suprema, Lugar Num. 2) 

O Rose Spector 
COUNTY TAX ASSESSOR-COLLECTOR 

(Asesor-Colector de lmpuestos del Condado) 

O Nancy Trout 
JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, Place 3 

(Juez, Code Suprema, Lugar Num. 3) 

LI Jack Hightower 

D Paul Banner 
CONSTABLE, Precinct No. 2 

(Condestable, Precinto Num. 2) 

O Cecil Cook 

The 9-1-1 Emergency 
Medical System is not in 
operation in Eastland 
County yet. It is in the 
testing phase, as reported 
at the last two County 
Commissioners meetings. 
The system was originally 
scheduled to be ready by 
January 31,1992. 

In the meanwhile the 
County Commissioners 
have mailed out cards to 
Rural Residents, officially 
notifying them of their 
new 9-1-1 address. This 
will become their P.O. 
mailing address at a later 
date. 

Note on the illustration 
that each rural residence 
has a number with a CR 
(County Road number). 
There is also a building 
ID number. These desig-
nations are for the con-
venience of the 9-1-1 Sys-
tem. 

JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS, Place 1 
(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar Num. 1) 

Li San-. Paxson 

U Charles F. (Charlie) Baird 
COUNTY DEMOCRATIC CHAIRMAN 

(Presidents del Condado) 

O Mrs. Scott J. Bailey 

O June Tucker Hicks 

O Write in 

JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS, Place 2 
(Juez, Corte 	Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar Num. 2) 

Li Morris L. Overstreet 

Li Gene Kelly 

Kokomo Club 
Stew Supper 
Held Feb. 22 

PRECINCT CHAIRMAN, Precinct No. 
(Presidents del Precinto, Precinto Num. 

0 

O Write in 

JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS. Place 3 

(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar Num. 3) 

C3 Pete Benavides 

REPUBLICAN PARTY PRIMARY ELECTION (ELECCION PRIMARIA DEL PARTIDO REPUBLICANO) 

(CONDADO DE) EASTLAND COUNTY, TEXAS 

MARCH 10, 1992 (10 DE MARZO 1992) 

SAMPLE BALLOT (BOLETA DE MUESTRA) 
INSTRUCTION NOTE: (NOTA DE INSTRUCCION:) 

Vote for the candidate of your choice in each race by placing an "X" In the square beside the candidate's name. (Vote por 
el candidata de su preferentia en cada terraria marcando con una "X" el cuadro al lado del nombre del candidate.) 

"I am a Republican and understand that I am ineligible to vote or participate in another political party's primary election or 
convention during this voting year." ("Yo soy Republicano y comprendo que no estoy °legible pare voter o participar en la elec-
tion primaria o la convention de algun otro partido politico durante este a-no electoral.") 

PREFERENCE FOR PRESIDENTIAL NOMINEE 
(Preferencia pare un candidate nombrado pare presidents) 
You may vote for one presidential candidate whose name 
appears on the ballot by placing an "X" in the square be-
side the candidate's name or you may vote as uncommitted 
by placing an "X" in the square beside "Uncommitted". 
Make only one choice. (Usted puede voter par un candidate 
pare presidents cuyo nombre aparece en la boleta por mar-
car con una "X" el cuadro al !ado del nombre del candidate 
o usted puede voter como votante no comprometido per mer-
cer con una "X" el cuadro al lado de las palabras no corn-
promoted°. Haga solamente una selection.) 

O David Duke 
O George Bush 
O Tennie Rogers 
O Patrick J. Buchanan 
O George A. Zimmermann 
O UNCOMMITTED (No Comprometido) 

U.S. REPRESENTATIVE, District 17 
(Representante de los Estados Unidos, Distrito Num. 17) 
Cl Jeannie Sadowski 

 

Montly-paying bank-issued CDs available through 
Edward D. Jones & Co. are Federally Insured to 
$100,000. Find out about them. Call today. 

Jim M. Bruton 
Investment Representative 

107 W. Main St. 
Eastland, TX 76448 

(817) 629-3851 Toll Free 800-441-5282 

1.2; Edward D. Jones & Co. 
Member Now York Stock Elchange, Inc and Secunles Investor Protection Corporation 

*CDs are available from institutions nationwide, issuer information available on 
retwest. May be subject to interest penalty for early withdrawal. Effective 2120/92, 
60-month, $5,000 deposit Subject to availability. Simple interest. 

  

LGI 	structioni 
CABMETS: ALL KMDS 

* Add-0ns 	 * Tape B Bed 
* Remodeling 	* Sheet Rock 
* Metal Buildings 	* Acoustics 
* Dew Construction 	* Texture 

Free Estimates 
Lgnn Hutton 	 Jim Ratliff 

817M5-75E32, Cross Plains 817/643-6464, Rising Star 

The annual Kokomo 
Extension Home Makers 
Club "Benefit Stew Sup-
per" was February 
22,1992, from 5:00 to 8:00 
p.m. and it was a big suc- 
cess. 	_ 	_ 

265 people attended the 
supper from Sipe Springs, 
Eastland, Olden, De Leon, 
Cisco, Albany, Lake Leon, 
Ranger, Abilene, Gor-
man, Carbon, Rising Star, 
Cross Plains, Lubbock, 
Austin, Burleson and 
Kokomo. 

Proceeds from the sup-
per go to the Gorman and 
Carbon Fire Departments 
and the Abilene Rehabili-
tation Center. 

The Club appreciates all 
those who participated. 

JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, Place 3 
(Juez, Cone Suprema, Lugar Num. 3) 

0 George Barbary 
O John D. Montgomery 

JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS, Place 1 
(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar Num. 1) 

❑ Jim Vollers 
O Joseph A. (Joe) Devany 

JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS, Place 2 
(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones Culminates, Lugar Num. 2) 

O Sue Lagarde 

PRESIDING JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS, 
Place 3 (Juez Presidents, Corte de Apelaciones 
Criminales, Lugar Num. 3) 
❑ Lawrence (Larry) Meyers 
O Ed Gray 

STATE SENATOR, District 22 
(Senador Estate], Distrito Num. 22) 
❑ Jane Nelson 

STATE REPRESENTATIVE, District 60 
(Representante Estatal, Distrito Num. 60) 
O Pete Lynch 

COUNTY CHAIRMAN (Presidents del Condado) 
O Richard Watson 
O Write in 

RAILROAD COMMISSIONER 
(Comisionado de Ferrocarriles) 
LI Barry Williamson 
U Carole Keeton Rylander 

JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, Place 1 
(Juez, Cone Supreme, Luger Num. 1) 

O Craig Enoch 
o Charles Ben Howell 

PRECINCT CHAIRMAN, Precinct No. 
(Presidents del Precinto, Precinto Num. 
O Write in 

JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, Place 2 
(Juez, Corte Suprema, Lugar Num. 2) 
Li Eugene Cook 

INSTRUCTION NOTE: (Note de Instruction:) 
Place an "X" in the square beside the statement indicating the way you wish to vote. (Marque con una "X" el cuadro al lado 
de la frase que indica la manera en que quiere usted voter.) 

0 FOR (A FAVOR DE) 	 Li AGAINST (EN CONTRA DE) 

"That an amendment to the Texas Constitution be submitted to the voters of Texas for approval, the terms to be limited in 
the following manner: (1) Governor, Lieutenant Governor. Attorney General, Comptroller of Public Accounts, Treasurer, Com-
missioner of the General Land Office - two, four-year terms, (2) members of the Texas Railroad Commission - one, six-year 
term, (3) members of the Texas Senate - two, four-year terms, (4) members of the Texas House of Representatives - four, two-
year terms; (5) Texas members of the U.S. Senate • two, six-year terms and (6) Texas members of the U.S. House of Represen-
tatives - four, two-year terms." ("Qua una enmienda al la Constitution de Texas sea sometida pare que la aprueban los votantes 
de Texas, la limitation de los plazas de poder en la siguiente manera: (1) Gobernador, Teniente Gobernador, Procurador Genera), 
Administrador de Cuentas Publicas, Tesorero, Comisionado de la Oticina General de Terrenos - dos plazas de cuatro ahos, (2) 
miembros de la Comision de Ferrocarril - un plaza de seis ahos, (3) miembros del Senado de Texas - dos plazas de cuatro ahos, 
(4) miembros de la Camara de Representantes de Texas - cuatro plazas de dos ahos; y (5) miembros Texanos del Senado de 
los Estados Unidos - dos plazas de seis ahos y (6) los miembros de la Cimara de Representantes de los Estados Unidos cuatro 
olazos de dos ahos.") 

Early Voting 
EARLY VOTING is underway at the County 
Clerk's Office and runs through March 6th for 
the Super Tuesday Primary Elections on March 
10th. Extensive Democratic and Republican 
sample ballots are shown here. The Democrats 
will have nine voting locations, and Republicans 
will be voting at five sites on March 10th. All early 
voting is in person or by mail to the County 
Clerk's Office. The Democratic ballot for each 
precinct is identical through the county chair-
man race where there is a contest for the first 
time in a number of years. June Tucker Hicks is 
challenging Mrs. Scott J. Bailey. The nine uncon-
tested Democratic precinct chairmen are as fol- 

lows: Eastland, Murl Campbell; Olden, Bobby 
Ray Walton; Ranger, Arturo R. Camacho; Desde-
mona, Dorothy Roberts; Gorman, Francis A. 
Simpson; Carbon, Phyllis A. Halford; Rising Star, 
Dorothy Dunn; Cisco, Dorothy Thomas; and Lake 
Leon, Roberto Newman. The Republican ballots 
for the five voting sites are identical down 
through the county chairman where Richard 
Watson is unopposed, after long-time chairman 
Jim Rarer did not seek re-election. Uncontested 
Republican precinct chairmen are: Eastland, Earl 
Bradley; Ranger, none filed; Gorman, Jamie 
Snider; Rising Star, Charles M. Barnes; and Cisco, 
none filed. 
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The Eastland County 
Youth Project Show was 
held inconjunction with 
the County 4-H and F.F.A. 
Livestock Show recently. 

Results of the Senior 
Project Show entries 
were: 

Senior Project Division: 
Grand Champion - Mi- 

chael Rabb, Nimrod 
Reserve Champion - 

Jackie Powledge, Nimrod 
Senior Bake Show Divi- 

sion: 
Grand Champion -Todd 

Wende, Eastland 
Reserve Champion -

Shondra Kellar, Olden 
Processes & Proce-

dures; 
1st - Holly Greenwood, 

Ranger 
Non-Original Metal; 
1st - Jackie Powledge, 

Nimrod 
Woodworking; 
1st - Michael Rabb, 

Nimrod 
2nd - Holly Greenwood, 

Ranger 

Drawings; 
1st - Holly Greenwood, 

Ranger 
Cakes; 
1st - Christina Bragg, 

Eastland 
2nd - Angela Hernan-

dez, Eastland 
3rd - Misty Williams, 

Eastland 
Participant Ribbons: 

Christina Bragg, Angie 
Gains, Holly Greenwood 

Pies; 

1st - Shondra Kellar -
Olden 

2nd - Monica Harbin -
Olden 

3rd - Abbey Jo Boles -
Ranger 

Yeast Breads; 
1st - Todd Wende, 

Eastland 
2nd- Tish Arther, 

Eastland 
Ouick Breads; 
1st - Barbara Squires, 

Eastland 
2nd- Barbara Squires, 

Eastland 
3rd - Vinetta Young, 

Eastland 
Participant Ribbons: 

Kelly Ishie, Holly Green-
wood 

Results of the Junior 
Project Show were: 

Junior Project Division: 
Grand Champion - 

Leigh Henke, Cisco 
Reserve Champion - 

Hannah Nicks, Nimrod 
Junior Bake Show Divi- 

sion: 
Grand Champion -

Courtney Ezzell, Rising 
Star 

Reserve Champion 
Miriam Nicks, Nimrod 

Wildlife Science-, 
1st - Katy Siebert, 

Eastland 
Rock &Mineral Collec-

tion; 
1st - Leigh Henke, Cisco 
2nd - Melissa Watts, 

Cisco 
Original Metal; 
1st - Jessica Keith, 

Olden 
Clothing; 
1st - Hannah Nicks, 

Nimrod 
Clothing Accessories:  
1st - Hannah Nicks, 

Nimrod 
Processes & Proce-

dures:  
1st- Tommy Seay, Olden 

Leathercraft:  
1st - Jessica Keith, 

Olden 
Needlecraft; 
1st - LeAnn Rabb, 

Nimrod 
2nd - Megan Driskill, 

Cisco 
Woodworking; 
1st - Jessica Keith, 

Olden 
Drawings; 
1st - Eric Watts, Cisco 
Decorative Clothing; 
1st - Jamie Smith, 

Eastland 
Costumes; 
1st - Jamie Agnew, 

Nimrod 
Cakes  
1st - Courtney Ezzell, 

Ronnie and Debbie 
Green of Rising Star are 
pleased to announce the 
engagement of their 
daughter, Wendy Dawn, 
to Brent Grady West, son 
of Grady and Sue West of 
DeLeon. 

The bride-elect , a 1991 
graduate of Rising Star 
High School is currently 
employed by J.C. Penney 
in Early. She is the grand-
daughter of Ruth Green 
and the late Homer Green 
and Ione White and the 
late Derrell White all of 
Rising Star. 

The prospective bride-
groom, a 1989 graduate of 
DeLeon High School is 
currently employed by 
McCoy's Lumber Com-
pany in Brownwood. He 
is the grandson of Curly 
and Vera West of DeLeon 
and Inez Lack and the late 
Aubrey Lack of 
Brownwood. Both attend 
Howard Payne Univer-
sity. 

An April 4 wedding is 
planned in the First Bap-
tist Church ofRisintStar. 

All friends and relatives 
are invited to attend. 

I, Billy Bush, would like to announce my candidacy for 
a position on the Rising Star School Board. I feel that 
the number one issue should be the morale of the 
teachers who are teaching our children to the best of 
their ability. If our teachers have no promises and no 
reason to try and do the job they are paid to do, then why 
should they want to? 

In my opinion some school board decisions in the past 
few years have not made the education of our children 
a priority. This has to be the number one objective of our 
school district. 

I feel that we; as the public, should be interested in 
seeing that our children get the very best education 
possible. 

I feel it is my duty as a citizen of Rising Star and a parent 
of children who are directly involved in the educational 
system to offer my services as an interested and con-
cerned person! 

Paid Pol. Adv. by Billy Bush and friends, Rt. 2, Box 120CD, Rising Star 76471 	itS9 
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Jergens 

Liquid 
Soup 

$1.29 

Ranch Style 

Beans 
15 oz. 

2/$1 

643-2221 
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People" which operates 81 
stores in North Texas and 
Oklahoma. The champion 
was shown by Lea Bern-
sen, a 4-H member from 
Robstown. 

Reserve grand cham-
pion steer, owned by 
Mindy Ballard of Roches-
ter 4-H Club, was pur-
chased for a record price 
of $32,000 by the bid team 
of Comerica Bank Texas, 
Walker Financial Corp., 
Natiional Health Insur-
ance and Haynes and 
Boone Law Firm of Fort 
Worth and Arlington. 

Commenting on the 
record-breaking show, 
Stock Show President and 
Manager W.R. Warr Jr. 
said, "The Stock Show is a 
tremendous undertaking 
and could not have suc-
ceeded without the spe-
cial talents provided to us 
by a great number of 
people who did a first-
class job, which included 
extending a warn wel-
come to the thousands of 
visitors. We appreciate 
the continued financial 
support from hundreds of 
individuals, organizations 
and businesses within our 
community who contrib-
uted greatly to our suc-
cess." 

The A and B Honor Roll 
and Distinguished Stu-
dent list for the Fall 1991 
semester has been an-
nounced atTarleton State 
University. 

Included on the list were 
217 students making the 
A Honor Roll and 971 
making the B Honor Roll. 
There were 918 Distin-
guished (D) Students 
named. 

students listed on the 
Honor Roll must have a 
4.0 grade point ratio 
(GPR) on the 4.0 system 
and be taking a minimum 
of 12 hours. Students on 
the B Honor Roll must 
have a grade point ratio 
between 3.00 and 3.99 
with no grade lower than 
B and taking a minimum 
of 12 hours. 

Distinguished Students 
includes freshmen and 
sophmore students who 
have a minimum GPR of 
3.25 with no grade lower, 
than C, and juniors and 
seniors who have a mini-
mum GPR of 3.50 with no 
grade lower than C and 
are in good standing. 

Honored are: 

RISING STAR: Alan J. 
Fleming, B,D; Josephine 
L. Hughes,B. 
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Youth Project Show Results 

Thursday, February 27, 1992 The Rising Star 

Engagement Announced TSU Honor 
Students 

Rising Star 
2nd - Miriam Nicks, 

Nimrod 
3rd - Hannah Nicks, 

Nimrod 
Pies:  
1st - Hannah Nicks, 	Fort Worth -Area young 

Nimrod 	 people were chosen win- 
2nd- Courtney Ezzell, ners at the 1992 South- 

Rising Star 	 western Exposition and 
rookies; 	 Livestock Show which 
1st - Courtney Ezzell, concluded a successful 17- 

Rising Star 	 day run Feb. 2. Winners 
2nd- Becca Siebert, from Rising Star included 

Eastland 	 Brandon Geye, second 
Yeast Breads; 	place, light weight Euro- 
1st - Dawn McDonald, pean cross steer; and 

Olden 	 Taylor Dean, fourth place, 
2nd - Leigh Henke, junior Simbrah heifer 

Cisco 	 calves, calved Jan. 1991. 
Quick Breads- 	 Of the over 17,000 head 
1st - Miriam Nicks, oflivestock judged during 

Nimrod 	 the Stock Show, some 
2nd - Courtney Ezzell, 6,800 were involved in the 

Rising Star 	 Junior Division, open to 
3rd - Libby Koenig, Texas youth who are ac- 

Ranger 	 Live in 4-H Clubs and FFA 
Ribbons for the show Chapters. 

were sponsored by the 	A banner year was 
Eastland County 4-H charted by the show, post-
Parent/Leader Associa- ing an attendance record 
tion. The Eastland Sr. 4- of 813,100 visitors, which 
H Club served as host for included a peak crowd of 
the Project Show. A spe- 144,593 at the World's 
cial thanks to Rhonda Original IndoorRodeo and 
Eckert, 4-H Club Man- people from 62 foreign 
alter; and Ann Lowry, countries. 
Eastland High School 	The grand champion 
Home Economics teacher, steer brought a near rec-
for their assistance. ord price of $50,000 on a 
Judges were: Murl top bid from Winn-Dixie 
Campbell, Twila Lee, Texas Inc., a supermar-
Gerry Zummer and Ar- ket chain called "The Beef 
leta Shirey. 

A special thanks to the 
buyers of the Grand 
Champion and Reserve 
Champion Bake Show 
entries which were: Ris- 

ing Star Ag Boosters, Dis-
trict Judge Jim Wright, 
David Coan and the 
Eastland Ag Boosters 
Club. 

Local Youth Win 

at Fort Worth 
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Want to help your family with it's finances! 
We'll help you open savings accounts for the kids. 

Loan you money to buy the wife a new washer or car. 
We can help you with personal loans 

or help you finance your business 
venture. We will also arrange a checking 

or savings account for you and your family. 
Bring your good credit and 
Come In and see us today! 

It is the policy of Peoples State Bank, consistent with 
sound banking operations, to meet the needs of 

the entire community and not to exclude or discriminate 
purposefully against any area of the community 

The YOUR FRIENDLY 
INDEPENDENT BANK 

Peoples State Bank 
of Clyde 

Rising 
A' i1 • A 
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