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K o y  W e ll No. 1
Put on 90 Barrels

A daily allowable of 90 barrels 
pending a 'Rail?oad Commission 
hearing July 17, has been given 
Cooper Gas Company, No. 1-A Jess 
Koy, this county’s first large oil 
producer.

The oil has been flowing into a 
two-inch pipe to Shell Pipeline’s 10- 
inch carrier to Houston. The well is 
producing gas and oil, the former 
rated 24,700,000 cubic feet and the 
latter 90.75 barrels hourly at 5605- 
40 feet and 110 hourly from 5520- 
70 feet. The gas is shut off at pre­
sent.

Cooper No. 2-A Koy, an offset of 
No. 1, is drilling well below 1,000 
feet, and drilling is proceeding 
steadily. This second well will be 
watched with great’ interest, as 
bringing in of another heavy pro­
ducer will be the signal for exten­
sive drilling operations by major 
companies who have Schleicher 
holdings.

Ex-Prisoners of War 
Attend Convention

Arthur and Jack Montgomery 
went to Austin during the weekend 
to attend sessions of the Texas 
Kriege Club, members of which 
have been prisoners of war.

It was decided to hold the next 
convention at Ft. Worth.

MENARD ROAD 
PLANS SENT TO 
HIGHWAY DEPT.

^^ch leicher County residents are
t^Vilant over news that the State 
Highway Department district office 
at San Angelo have completed 
plans for the Menard-Eldorado 
highway, bonds for which were vot­
ed many months ago. It is hoped 
that the contract for the road work 
will be let within the coming week.

County officials state that the 
county’s part in the project is prac­
tically completed, and that there 
will be no local hitches to slow down 
the work. The data in the project 
is now in the State Highway De­
partment office, and it is expected 
that an early start will be made in 
this new highway.

Methodist Guest 
Speaker To Be Heard

Rev. Clifford Zirkel, Adult Con­
ference worker, whose home is in 
San Antonio, will be a guest at the 
Methodist Church Saturday night 
and Sunday, July 13 and 14.

On Saturday evening at 8:00 p. 
m., he will meet with the congrega 
tion for a conference session fol­
lowed by a social hour with the 
Wesley Adult Class as hosts. On 
Sunday at 10:00 a. m., Rev. Zirkel 
will hold conference with the two 
adult classes and will preach at the 
11:00 a. m. service.

He will accompany Rev. Faust to 
Rudd where he will preach Sunday 
afternoon, returning here to preach 
again at the regular Sunday eve­
ning services at 8:00 p. m.

Rev. Zirkel comes here well rec­
ommended. A young man, he is a 
graduate of Westmoreland College, 
and has done post-graduate work at 
Yale. He comes from a Methodist 
family, who have lived in San An­
tonio for many years, and are mem­
bers and prominent workers in the 
Travis Park Methodist Church 
there. His father, C. H. Zirkel is 
co-owner of the Zirkel Monument 
Company.
. It has been announced that Rev.

H k  B. McCreary of Bronte will be 
the preacher for the Methodist re­
vival here from August 4-11.

COURT CANVASES 
ELECTION VOTE 
FOR MEMORIAL

The Commissioners’ Court Mon­
day canvassed the vote on the 
Memorial Park $50,000 bond elec­
tion and studied architects’ plans 
for the building in preparation for 
advertising for bids.

Two out-of-town architects pre­
sented plans for the building, but 
no definite commitment was made 
by the commissioners.

The bonds were sold to Dewar 
Pancost and Robinson and bids will 
be advertised for at a later date. 
More discussion of the recreation 
center, bonds for which were ap 
proved June 29 by a 2-1 vote of 
Schleicher County residents, is ex­
pected at the next Commissioners' 
meeting August 12. The memorial 
will be erected in memory of War 
veterans from Schleicher County.

Sugar Rationing 
Still In Force 
Official Warns

“ All phases of sugar rationing 
program are still in force,’’ Cal C. 
Straughan, sugar rationing officer 
of the San Antonio area said re­
cently.

“ Reports indicate that there is 
considerable misunderstanding on 
the part of consumers and indust­
rial users concerning the status of 
sugar rationing during the hiatus 
period of price control, and that 
some dealers are selling sugar 
without collecting ration points. 
This is a violation, and is subject 
to all penalties of the Second War 
Powers Act,’’ Straughan explained

This act, Straughan said, was ex­
tended to March 31, 1947, by Con­
gress, and this extension was signed 
by the President on Saturday of 
last week. The president issued an 
executive order on June 30 that spe­
cifically directed OPA to continue 
to perform all functions relating to 
sugar rationing.

While the sugar rationing, pro­
gram is in effect, consumers should 
retain family ration books in their 
possession, Straughan said. Other 
sugar users, such as industrial, in­
stitutional, wholesalers, and re­
tailers are also advised to retain 
unused ration evidence and records 
in their possession.

Straughan also reminded home 
canners that Spare Stamp No. 10 
was validated July 1, 1946. How­
ever, he urged consumers not to 
spend Spare Stamp No. 10 until 
they actually have fruit on hand to 
be canned, as there will be no other 
sugar allocated for canning purpos­
es during 1946.

Mr. and Mrs. E. E. Newlin and 
Mrs. E. H. Sweatt attended funeral 
services Tuesday afternoon in San 
Angelo for the infant daughter 
born July 9 to Mr. and Mrs. Edward 
Newlin. The baby was dead upon 
birth. Mrs. Newlin’s condition was 
reported as fair.

Aged Schleicher 
County Resident 
Buried Saturday

Funeral services for Mrs. W. T. 
Conner, 87, resident of Schleicher 
County since 1907, were held at 
the home of a son and daughter-in- 
law, Mr. and Mrs. O. E. Conner 
Saturday afternoon at 5:00 o’clock 
with the Rev. J. M. Hays, pastor of 
the First Baptist Church officiat­
ing. He was assisted by the Rev. 
F. B. Faust, pastor of the First 
Methodist Church, and the Rev. 
D. I. Miller, pastor of the Funda­
mentalist Baptist Church.

Interment was in the Eldorado 
Cemetery with the Ratliff Funeral 
Home in charge.

Mrs. Conner died early Saturday 
morning at the home of a son-in- 
law and daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
John McLeod, Pontotoc, with whom 
she had made her home since the 
death of her husband in 1940. The 
body was brought overland in a 
Brady Funeral Coach.

Harriett Williamson was born 
April 19, 1859, at Bagdad, William­
son County, and she was married 
to the late W. T. Conner on Jan. 
29, 1882. Five children, two girls 
and three boys, one of whom died 
in infancy were born to the couple. 
She was a life-long member of the 
First Baptist Church.

Immediate survivors include two 
daughters, Mrs. McLeod, Pontotoc; 
and Mrs. J. L. Neill, Eldorado; two 
sons, John Conner, Kingsville and 
Orville Conner, Eldorado; eight 
grandchildren, and three great­
grandchildren.

Pallbearers were Clyde Gal- 
breath, Lionell Ballew, Palmer 
West, Keno Ogden, Will Isaacs and 
C. L. Meador, Jr.

Out o f town relatives attending 
the services were: Mr. and Mrs. C. 
R. Woolsey and daughter, Alice 
Ann and Eugene Woolsey, nephews 
of Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. John 
Conner, Kingsville; Mr. and Mrs. 
John McLeod, Pontotoc; Mr. and 
Mrs. Wilford McLeod and son, Bill 
of Pampa; Mr. Davis, Amarillo; 
Dale McLeod, Las Animas, Colo.; 
Mr. and Mrs. George H. Neill, Son­
ora; Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Taylor, 
Mr. and Mrs. Reed, San Angelo, 
and Robert Martin, Dallas.

Bitterweed Pulling 
Barbecue Monday 
Sponsored by Lions

The annual bitterweed pulling, 
sponsored by the Lions Club, will 
take place next Monday, July 15 al 
4:00 p. m. with workers covering 
the town section, followed by a bar­
becue on the courthouse lawn. Joe 
Brown Ross of Sonora will be the 
principal speaker.

It is generally surmised that the 
pulling will be lighter this year due 
to the drouth and the energy with 
which previous campaigns have 
been conducted.

Eldorado Churches 
Clean Their Yards

Members of the Presbyterian 
congregation recently gathered at 
their church for a “ weed pulling 
and grass mowing” party. All 
working together soon made the 
lawn about the church and manse 
a very attractive place.

Men and women of the Methodist 
Church worked Wednesday after­
noon on the church lawn and will 
work again today (Thursday) to 
clear the yard of unattractive grass 
and weeds which have gained too 
much foothold for the regular jan­
itor to take care of.

Ballots Printed For 
Democratic Primary

Election ballots for the July 27 
primary election, were printed at 
the Success office during the past 
week end and delivered to E. C. 
Hill, county Democratic Chairman. 
H. T. Finley, county clerk, re­
ports that a few calls have come in 
for absentee ballots and these are 
being supplied this week.

Good Record Of 
Tax Collections

In a check-up at the sheriff and 
tax collector’s office Tuesday, it 
was revealed that 97.8% of the 1945 
State and County and Common 
School taxes had been payed up to 
July 1 when annual reports are 
made. Taxes not paid by that time 
are placed on the delinquent roll.

NEW DAUGHTER
Mr. and Mrs. F. L. Powers, Jr , 

of Alpine, are the parents of a 
daughter born Friday, July 5. The 
baby weighed 8Yz pounds and has 
been named Linda Sue. Mrs. Pow­
ers is the former Venita Davis, 
daughter of G. H. (Dick) Davis, 
and sister of Mrs. W. C. Doyle of 
this place. Paternal grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. F. L. Powers of 
Kansas.

Mrs. Doyle and Betty Mae left 
Sunday for a few days visit with 
her sister and family. They were 
accompanied to Alpine by Mr. Pow­
ers who came here for them.

RECEIVE DEGREES
Among candidates receiving de­

grees from Sul Ross College at the 
close of the summer session Aug. 
22 are Charles A. Reynolds, super­
intendent of the local school, who 
will receive his Master of Arts de­
gree and Lawton Brevard of Talpa, 
husband of the former Tommye 
Davidson, will receive his Bachelor 
of Science degree.

C’HRISTOVAL RAISES 
SCHOOL TAX RATE

In an election held last Saturday, 
voters of the Christoval Indepen­
dent School District approved by a 
majority of nearly two to one a 
proposal to raise the maximum 
school tax rate from $1.00 to $1.50. 
The vote was 58 in favor of the 
proposal and 33 against. Approval 
does not necessarily mean that the 
tax rate will be upped to the $1.50 
maximum.

A portion of the tax increase will 
be employed to “ hire teachers at 
the present high salary rates,” 
Lewis Hale, school board secretary 
said.

ON BAPTIST HOUR

Dr. R. Paul Caudill, Baptist Hour 
speaker for next Sunday morning, 
July 14, will discuss the subject, 
“ Christian Strategy for World 
Conquest,” as announced by the 
Radio Committee of the Southern 
Baptist Convention, S. F. Lowe, 
Director, Atlanta, Georgia.

Dr. Caudill, Pastor of the First 
Baptist Church of Memphis, Tenn., 
leaves on an extensive tour of for­
eign mission fields soon after his 
Baptist Hour engagement, accord­
ing to the Atlanta announcement; 
Mr. Lowe states further that his 
abiding interest in world missions 
and his careful study of mission ob­
jectives and methods eminently pre­
pare Dr. Caudill for discussing his 
subject.

The 'Baptist Hour is broadcast 
over an independent network which 
carries the Methodist and Presby­
terian Hours at other seasons, and 
may be heard in this state.

e n m g
28th

Highway Department 
Releases New Map

Another bid for out-of-state tour­
ists is in the making as the Texas 
Highway Department announces 
limited quantities of its first post­
war color travel map now rolling 
o ff the presses.

The expected bumper crop of 
summer tourists in the Lone Star 
State will be guided over Texas 
highways with the aid of a map 
that will give visitors a brief intro­
duction to a few of the State’s 
points of interest. In addition it 
will afford a complete, accurate, 
easy-to-ready travel map for the 
use of all.

The de luxe map is expected to 
be the most popular feature at the 
Department’s Information Bureaus 
which have been reopened at stra­
tegic points to supply post-war 
tourists with reliable, up-to-date 
facts on highways and tourist at­
tractions which support one of the 
state’s largest and fastest growing 
“ cash crops.”

The postwar edition carries a 
small scale map of the United 
States, the usual large scale insets 
of the State’s metropolitan areas, 
strip maps of the main Texas tra­
vel routes and the Pan American 
highway into Mexico. It gives 
mileages between towns and car­
ries a supplementary mileage chart. 
The highway marking system is 
explained with illustrations and 
there is a column of miscellaneous 
facts about the nation’s largest 
State.

Shown also are the State and 
National parks, some of the old 
Missions, and other points of his­
torical interest. Twenty-six color 
pictures, which will be changed in 
each subsequent edition, depict 
typical Texas scenes.

The outside of the map, when 
folded for mailing, bears a picture 
of the State Capitol and another of 
Governor Coke Stevenson. Below 
the Governor’s picture is his offi­
cial greeting “ To Motorists Every­
where.”  In his message Governor 
Stevenson extends to the people of 
other States and Nations a cordial 
invitation to visit Texas and enjoy 
the hospitality of its people. “The 
highways of Texas are yours,”  he 
says. “ Use them freely for your 
business and pleasure.”

Mrs. Davis Leaves 
For Naples, Italy

Mrs. Paul Davis and two and 
one-half year old son, Dickie, left 
Monday for Naples, Italy, to join 
Captain Davis, who has been there 
since March. She has been living in 
San Angelo with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. C. H. Meadows, for the 
last few months, and has visited 
often in Eldorado with her sister- 
in-law, Mrs. W. C. Doyle, and her 
father-in-law, G. H. Davis.

Planning to remain only a year, 
Mrs. Davis is taking nothing but 
clothes, linen, the baby’s playthings 
and a few cooking utensils. Her 
greatest difficulty was in purchas­
ing winter clothes at this, time of 
the year, she said.

En route to New York from 
Uhere she will sail, Mrs. Davis will 
visit in Columbus, Ohio.

Captain Davis is also a brother 
of Lum Davis of this place, and a 
former resident here.

Mrs. Liza Bridges of San Antonio 
is here for a few days visit with her 
mother, Mrs. J. R. Word, and her 
brother, W. R. Word.

The Eldorado Municipal Airport 
will be formally opened Sunday, 
July 28, with an all-day entertain­
ment featuring air performances, 
a rodeo, and a free barbecue at 
noon for flyers. *.

The airport, with its three turfed 
runways, CAA approved, is located 
at the western outskirts of the city. 
The Lions, who are sponsoring pub­
licizing of the event will have 
charge of the event, and will pre­
pare the grounds for entertainment 
of many visitors.

Information concerning the ail 
day Opening is being mailed out 
this week, and the Lions are antici­
pating a most successful get- 
together of Texas flyers.

Candidates’ Rally 
at Reynolds School

The annual Candidates’ Rally is 
being planned by the Reynolds 
Home Demonstration Club for Fri­
day evening, July 19, at 8:30 o ’clock 
at the Reynolds school building.

This year’s rally will take the 
form of a supper and 42 party Lad­
ies are asked to prepare the suppers 
bring them along either in a sock, 
boxes or sacks tied with a sock, as 
tacky as possible, together with 
their husbands, sweethearts or 
friends, with “well filled pocket 
books.”  The owner will keep the 
mate to the sock and when boxes 
are sold, supper and 42 partners 
are found by matching the socks. 
The main thing is not to let friend 
“ Hubby” or your date, know or see 
the kind of sock you use.

Half of the proceeds will go into 
the school fund, with the other half 
being retained in the club treasury. 
Candidates, of course, will come 
with well prepared speeches!

Sponsored by the club, the affair 
has been an annual occasion for the 
last several election years, and al­
ways draws a large crowd. Other 
money making schemes used at the 
rally in former years included ice 
cream suppers, bingo games, etc. 
The sock supper is a new thing in 
this community, but has proven a 
success in other places.

The public is invited to attend 
this rally, which, so far as is known, 
is the only one being held in the 
county this year.

Firemen to Attend 
A & M Short Course

The Eldorado Volunteer Firemen 
expect to send several delegates to 
the Firemen’s Training School 
short course at A & M College July 
14 through 19, according to Chief 
Palmer West.

In the refresher course, training 
will be received on the latest meth­
ods and other worthwhile instruc­
tion in firefighting and the use of 
equipment given.

Firemen sending delegates are 
also given credit through the course 
on their state insurance, amounting 
to a 3% credit on the key rate. 
This factor, however, is not so im­
portant, as is the potential worth of 
what they really learn at the school 
according to Chief West, who hopes 
to have as many as four attend.

Mr. and Mrs. George Long have 
returned home from a few days 
visit in Quanah with relatives of 
Mrs. Long. They also attended to 
business matters regarding the es­
tate of Mrs. Long’s mother, the 
latfe Mrs. Ruby Hart.

m

Jack Shugart, new deputy sher­
iff, was unable to report for duty 
this week due to illness.
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WANT ADS
FOR SALE—Four room modern 
house in Glendale addition. Posses­
sion at once. Hugo Mika, Carrizo 
Springs, Texas. Phone 226. 4tc

FOR SALE—Duroc Jersey Boar
Hog, two brood sows and pigs------
Victor Kent. 25-26c

NEW SHIPMENT— of Emerson 
radios and heating pads.— Topliffe 
Gas and Electric Service. 28-c

FOR SALE—22 Marlin pump rifle. 
—Topliffe Gas and Electric. 28-c

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to express our 

grateful appreciation to those who 
donated blood for transfusions, for 
the flowers, cards, and other acts 
of kindness shown our wife and 
mother while she was in the hos­
pital.
—The Russell Donaldson family. 1c

Jhi&tin&L
"Pink Eye” Powder

Easy to apply. Quick to act.
Stops "pink eye" losses. A 5-gram 
bottle—enough to treat 30 to 40 
CB5es—$1.00. For sale by—

Walston Stock Medicine Company

S C A L P  T R O U B L E !
You must find DURHAM 'S RE*
SORCIN the best preparation ever 
used for itching scalp, loose dan­
druff or fa lling hair or purchase 
price promptly refunded. Large
bottle only 75c at 

Hoover Drug Store, Eldorado 
-' -

ROBERT MASSIE 
FUNERAL HOME

Ambulance Service 
SAN ANGELO, TEXAS 

TELEPHONE 4444

POLITICAL
ANNOUNCEMENTS

Rates: (Cash With Order)
Precinct O ffice s___________$7.50
District & County Offices__$10.00 
State Offices ____________ $15.00

Note: The above prices includes 
one (1) write-up of not exceeding 
250 words; additional wording will 
be charged for at regular reader 
advertising rate. (10c line). This 
price does not include a subscrip­
tion to this publication.

The Eldorado Success is author­
ized to announce the following 
names of candidates for office, 
subject to the action of the Demo­
cratic Primaries in July, 1946:

For STATE SENATOR, 25th Dist.

DORSEY B. HARDEMAN

PENROSE B. METCALF

FOR ASSOCIATE JUSTICE 
COURT OF CIVIL APPEALS 
THIRD SUPREME JUDICIAL 
DISTRICT:

ROBERT G. HUGHES
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Mrs. Fred Gunstead left Wednes­
day for Iowa to visit relatives.

Mrs. H. Z. Pennington has been 
seriously ill at her home here. Sev­
eral of the children have been at 
her bedside.

Mrs. Ira Locklear has just re­
turned home from a visit with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. T. Loucks 
at San Saba.

Mrs. John Hall and daughters, 
Marian and Jeanene are visiting on 
the ranch with her sister, Mrs. Ira 
Locklear and Mrs. Locklear.

Mr and Mrs. F. B. Alexander and 
children left Wednesday for their 
new home at Lubbock. Their house­
hold goods were moved Tuesday.

NEW SHIPMENT of Emerson 
Radios. Topliffe Gas and Electric 
Company. c

For Free and Prompt 
Removal of

DEAD
OR DISABLED 

ANIMALS
Call Collect 

San Angelo: 7271-1 
or 4023-2

SAN ANGELO 
RENDERING CO.

Clean, Sanitary Trucks

WATERSHED 
FLOOD CONTROL 
PROGRAM SET UP

The Middle Colorado River wa­
tershed flood control program is 
without equal in agricultural his­
tory. Although it is only one of 11 
similar projects authorized by the 
United States Congress for post­
war operations in the 1944 Flood 
Control Act, the Middle Colorado 
program is ranked high in impor­
tance.

Never before has such an attempt 
been made on so large a scale to 
reduce the frequency and severity 
of floods by holding more rain wa­
ter on the uplands where it falls 
and by retarding the run-off of the 
remainder.

The Middle Colorado project has 
been included in all watershed flood 
control planning since the Omnibus 
Flood Control Act of 1936 estab­
lished a new national policy on 
flood control. The Department of 
Agriculture’s watershed flood con­
trol program is based on a detailed 
survey of the Middle Colorado Riv­
er watershed completed in 1941. 
Three agencies of the Department 
of Agrculture— the Soil Conserva­
tion Service, the Forest Service and 
the Bureau of Agricultural Econo­
mics cooperated in making the de­
tailed survey of the 7,200 square 
miles comprising the Middle Color­
ado flood control project. As a re­

sult of the survey, the Departmeiit 
in 1942 proposed a comprehensive 
soil conservation program which 
Congress authorized in the 1944 
Act for post-war operations, the 
work to be completed within 20 
years. This program will supple­
ment the War Department’s down­
stream flood control plans for res­
ervoirs, levees and other major 
structures.

As described in the Department 
of Agriculture survey report, the 
Middle Colorado River watershed 
includes Brady Creek, Hords Creek, 
San Saba River, Jim Ned Creek, 
Pecan Bayou and the main stream 
from the mouth of the Concho to 
the mouth of Pecan Bayou. The ar­
ea includes all of McCullough 
County and parts of Taylor, Calla­
han, Eastland, Runnels, Coleman, 
Brown, Comanche, Concho, San 
Saba, Mills, Schleicher, Menard,. 
Mason, Sutton and Kimble counties.

The flood control program will be 
carried out through soil conserva­
tion districts which now cover 95 
per cent of the Middle Colorado 
watershed.

Because of the public benefits to 
be derived from the program and 
the need for completing the work 
as soon as possible, federal funds 
will he used to pay for a part of 
the cost of installing some of the 
required measures.

The major problems are soil ero­
sion and surface run-off on the up­
lands. By-products of this upland

Today’s Kitchen Is Attractive and Efficient

FOR SHERIFF, TAX ASSESSOR 
A N D  COLLECTOR:

E. H. (Greasy) SWEATT

WALLACE JOINER

FOR COUNTY TREASURER: 
MRS. MABEL PARKER

FOR DIST. & COUNTY CLERK: 
H. T. (Dogie) FINLEY

FOR COUNTY JUDGE 
C. L. MEADOR, Jr.

COMMISSIONER, precinct 1: 

J. E. SPENCER 

C. A. GRAVES

COMMISSIONER, precinct 4: 
LAWRENCE MOORE

FOR U. S. CONGRESS, 21st Dist 
O. C. FISHER (re-election)

COMMISSIONER, precinct 2: 
L. G. EDMISTON

KILL RED ANTS! You can easily
rid your premises of Red Ant Beds 
with Durham's Extermo Ant 
Bells at a cost of less than 5c per 
den. Six Balls 30c and 12 Balls 50c
ctf vour druggist or at

Hoover Drug Store, Eldorado

. ~ A  ; 
. **

» l'laids for eye-appeal, cupboards for convenience keynote this com­
pact kitchen. The cabinets come in a variety of styles and may be installed 
independently. Wooden cabinets are easily painted any color after in­
stallation.

BECAUSE the kitchen is not only 
the homemaker’s p r in c ip a l 

workroom but the heart of the 
home as well, it must not only be 
efficient but attractive as well, the 
Rural Home editor of nationally- 
circulated Capper’s Farmer points 
out.

Appliances—the supporting cast 
to the homemaker’s star role—have 
been vastly improved, she writes. 
They make work easier, cleaner 
and save time. Ranges, refrigera­
tors and sinks have been precision- 
built. They include automatic fea­
tures that take over much tedious 
responsibility and give improved re­
sults.

“ Much of our modern equipment 
in kitchens is being installed rather

than built in,”  she declares. “ Some 
manufacturers of ranges and refrig­
erators now have kitchen units com­
plete with various types of cabinets 
and base units. These may be in­
stalled or removed independently of 
other pieces in the same room. 
When an entire kitchen cannot be 
purchased outright, it may be got­
ten a piece„ at a time. These units 
may be grouped in almost any num­
ber of arrangements, depending on 
size of family, the kitchen and the 
pocketbook.”

A workable kitchen must have 
each piece of equipment placed in 
relation to other pieces, she adds. 
Then work moves smoothly and 
easily with a minimum of wasted 
effort.

destruction include sedimentation 
of fertile bottomland, stream chan­
nels and reservoirs, more frequent 
and disastrous flooding and higher 
flood crests. Secondary though 
costly results include interruption 
in public utility services, washed 
out roads, bridges and railroad 
tracks, and damage to urban prop­
erty.

Total estimated cost of installing 
the Middle Colorado flood control 
program is $3,360,000, including 
$2,693,000 authorized by Congress 
to be approprited over the 20-year 
treatment period. The share of the 
farmers and ranchers in the instal­
lation work is valued at $667,000, 
practically all of it for labor, equip­
ment and materials available on the 
farm.

Predominnnt use of the land in 
the Middle Colorado watershed is 
for the production of livestock. 
Over-grazing has left the ranges 
and pastures unprotected and hence 
subject to erosion. The eroded land 
causes excessive run-off which re­
sults in the ruinous floods, parti­
cularly in the tributary areas.

Of the annual average flood dam­
age of $662,000, land on the small 
tributaries suffers 76%. Damage 
to crops and pastures accounts for 
most of the total loss.

The flood problem in the Middle 
Colorado watershed can be divided 
into these three parts: that occur­
ring on small creeks and branches, 
that on the main stems of the San 
Saba River, Brady Creek and Pe­
can Bayou and that on the main 
stem of the Colorado River.

When measured in dollars and 
cents, benefits of the work are 
great. Each dollar of total cost will 
return benefits of $3.44, it is calcu­
lated. Each dollar invested by the 
federal government will return 
$1.46 in flood control benefits. To­
tal direct flood control benefits are 
estimated at $137,000 annually, 
This represents a 21% reduction in 
flood damage.

Greatest benefits, however, will 
be in terms of increased production 
from cropland and grassland and in 
lower farm and ranch operating 
costs. These benefits will approxi­
mate $1,519,00 a year.

Farmers and ranchers are not 
the only ones who will benefit from 
the flood control program. The pub­
lic in general will reap substantial 
benefits in the reduction of damage 
to urban property, public utility 
service, highways and recreational 
facilities. And it must he remem­
bered, too, that an entire commun­
ity benefits when the surrounding 
farms are productive and prosper­
ous.

:

:

SPIRELLA
Corsets, Girdles and Brassiers 

made to your individual measure­
ments—

For free demonstration, in the 
privacy of your bedroom—

CALL

M rs. Euda B. Isaacs
Phone 232

ELDORADO, TEXAS

West Texas Cafe
•; Lester C. (Jack) Hoffman, Prop.

DINNER PLA TE ______________ 60c
STEAKS— SHORT ORDERS 

H ours______________ 6 a. m. to 9 p. m.

'

Cox-Vautrain Funeral Home
500 W. Beauregard — San Angelo

AirConditioned AmbulanceService
DIAL 3113

I

Mrs. Marion Joseph and son, 
Ralph of San Antonio spent Thurs­
day through Saturday visiting with 
her mother, Mrs. Dena White.

NEW SHIPMENT of Emerson 
Radios. Topliffe Gas and Electric 
Company. e

Mrs. Paul Nixon has gone to 
Dove Creek, Colo., for a visit with 
her son, Lafayette Nixon and fam­
ily. She will be away for most of 
the summer.

: IT ’S VACATION T IM E !
But — though summer is here —your 
hair still needs regular care if it is to 
have that soft shiny look!

Let us take care of it for you.

Eldorado Beauty Shop
Fay McAlpine

O o I sl .  f o i .

B EA U F0 R D  JES TER
of Corsicana for

g o v e r n o r
Beauford Jester long has been an active worker 
for the better things in life—church, welfare, 
civic development, education, agriculture and 
athletics. He has served with distinction on the 
Texas Railroad Commission. His record as a 
citizen, public official and soldier justifies his 
promotion to the governorship of Texas.

Vote For BEAUFORD JESTER For Governor U

\
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Vases—Crystal (open stock)—Glasses—Water Sets- -China—Gift Items—Ovenware—Genuine Pyrex—Tea, Table & Iced TeaSpoons 
Linoleum Rug's—Johnson Wax—Fuller Brushes and Mops—See the many other items in stock. Call Mrs. J. L. Neill.

ELDORADO HARDWARE COMPANY—Phone 15 5
Mrs. Frank Webb, who has been 

undergoing medical treatment at 
Fredericksburg and visiting with 
relatives in Harper for the last 
several weeks, is now visiting at 
the home of her son and his wife,

Mr. and Mrs. Oran Webb o f Ozona, 
where she will be until August 1, 
when she will return to her home 
here. Mrs. Webb visited in Eldorado 
Tuesday, and says her condition is 
much improved.

:

:

Eldorado 
Welding Shop

ACETYLENE AND ELECTRIC 
WELDING

MINOR REPAIRS

Full Line of 
HUMBLE PRODUCTS

:

:

Plenty of ESSO No. 3 OIL 
Naphtha and Kerosene 

Cigarettes —  Candy— Cold Drinks

:

:

C. V. CARROLL - PROP.

Notice
We are not raising prices on any 
items except in cases where the 
manufacturers have raised prices 
on us.

We carry complete line of 
Barbara Gould Cosmetics

\

Page Drug Store

Life Fire Hail

MRS. RAY 0. SPROUL
General Insurance • *

Hospitalization Automobile

Barrow
JewelryStore

SONORA, TEXAS

With two repair m en now  on 
the job, w e can g ive  you  

. from 2 to 4  day service on
1 l  n  1 i  ■ ■all watch & c lock  repairing.

ALL WORK GUARANTEED

Shower Honors 
Recent Bride

Honoring Mrs. W. F, Edmiston, 
the former Earlene Coulter, a num­
ber pf ladies of the WSCS enter­
tained with a gift shower Saturday 
afternoon in the reception rooms of 
the Methodist Church.

Greeting guests were Mmes. D. 
E. De Long, E. H. Coulter, E. N. 
Edmiston, Miss Tommie Lee Wilson 
and the honoree. Misses Mary 
Cloud, Mary Dell Edmiston, Joyce 
Burk and Mrs. Palmer West assis­
ted in receiving the gifts.

A yellow, green and white color 
scheme was carried out in the dec­
orations with the lace covered table 
arranged with a bowl of yellow 
dahlias and flanked by yellow can­
dles in green holders. Bowls of 
shasta daisies, yellow zinnias and 
white daisies were placed about the 
room, further emphasizing the col­
or scheme.

Miss Charlene Edmiston, who 
made the bride’s book, also presided 
at it, and iVJrs. Orval Edmiston and 
Mrs. Joe Wagley presided at the 
punch bowl.

A musical program was present­
ed with Mrs. F. B. Faust and Miss 
Katherine Davis at the piano dur­
ing the tea hour. Two piano selec­
tions were given by Miss Emily 
Ann Harper, a violin number by 
Mrs. Earl Ralston accompanied by 
her mother, Mrs. Faust, and two 
solos, “ It Might as Well be Spring” 
and “ Sweet and Lovely” by Kather­
ine Davis, accompanied by Mrs. 
Ralston.

Personal Items
Mr. and Mrs. W. M. Patterson 

and daughter, Marselaine, spent 
July 4 and the week end visiting 
with relatives in Hillsboro.

H. W. Williams of Tulsa, Okla., 
is visiting here with his nieces, 
Miss Georgia Springstun, Mrs. 
Ruth Danford, Mrs. Jess Koy and 
his nephew, T. G. Springstun.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Furr and 
daughter, Freddie Fae and a friend 
from Goose Creek are visiting this 
week with the Whit Smith family.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe T. Lawrence 
have moved here from Victoria to 
make their home. They are living 
at the home of her father, S. 
Stanford.

Bobby Nolan of San Antonio is 
visiting here with his grandmother, 
Mrs. Jim Mercer.

Mr. and Mrs. Orbie Bradshaw 
and family o f Electra are visiting 
this week with his uncle, Jess Brad­
shaw and other relatives.

Bonnie Biggs, another high 
school student, is employed at the 
West Texas Cafe.

Mr. and Mrs. Wyatt B. Means 
have moved to Beaumont to make 
their home. Mr. Means is employed 
in Port Arthur with an insurant 
adjustment company. Mrs. Means, 
the former Pauline Kent, and their 
baby daughter, made their home 
here with her mother, Mrs. A. E. 
Kent, while Mr. Means was in ser­
vice.

Mr and Mrs. Oswald Crenshaw 
and daughter, Gail of Albany, Ore., 
spent Sunday and Monday with Mr. 
Crenshaw’s aunts, Mrs. A. L. Arch­
er and Mrs. Felix Susan.

Jack Ratliff, Schleicher County 
ranchman, who has a fine bunch of 
Suffolk sheep, has sold two year­
ling bucks at $50 per head, and 
eight five-year-old ewes at $25 per 
head, to Charles Chaney o f Utopia. 
Ratliff, a few months ago purchas­
ed a flock of Suffolks from Silver- 
thorne of Plainview. Both Silver- 
thorne and Ratliff have been con­
sistent buyers of Suffolk sales at 
San Angelo each year.

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Jackson and 
daughter were called to Sanders- 
ville, Ga. last week on account of 
the serious illness of Mrs. Jackson’s 
mother, Mrs. Heath, who was to 
undergo an operation Friday, July 
5. The family left here Tuesday of 
last week.

Mrs. George Cartwright, the for­
mer Leola Sauer, met her husband^ 
Capt. Cartwright in San Antonio 
recently, upon his return from ser­
vice in Japan. Capt. Cartwright, 
whose home is in Indianapolis, Ind, 
has received his discharge from tin 
service, and at present the couple’i 
plans are undecided.

Anita iRunge, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. J. F. Runge, is on a sev­
eral weeks vacation trip to points 
in Alabama and North Carolina 
where she is visiting with friends 
and relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. J. F. Runge and 
sons, Dick and Jim, spent Saturday 
at the ranch home of Mrs. Runge’s 
mother, Mrs. R. S. Windslow near 
Menard and attended a family re­
union. Mrs. Runge’s brother-in-law 
and sister, Mr. and Mrs. Z. A. Boyd 
and three children of Seattle, 
Wash., were present for the re­
union. The Runge’s daughter, Mae, 
accompanied them home after a
ten-day visit with her grandmother.

____  1
Mrs. Archie Wright is visiting 

this week in Uvalde with her sister.

Barbara Mund, accompanied by 
her father, Arthur Mund, went to 
Dallas Saturday where she enrolled 
in Draughon’s Business College 
for a business course.

Lt. Kathryn Montgomery has' 
written her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. B. Montgomery from Germany, 
that she plans to begin prepara­
tions for her home coming about 
August 10. She will probably be 
home some time in September. Lt.

Montgomery is a dietition with the 
97th Hospital located in Germany.

The Bert Page family spent sev­
eral days recently at their ranch 
on the San Saba river near Menard 
enjoying fishing and camping.

ALLAN SHIVERS 
CITES PLATFORM

Senator Allan Shivers’ platform 
for lieutenant governor briefly in­
cludes: Real assistance to Texas 
war veterans, increased salaries for 
teachers, a first-class university 
for the colored, better highways 
and farm-to-market roads, redis­
tricting, full payment of old-age 
pensions, reorganization of the 
legislature with 60-day sessions 
each year, an expanded public 
health program, reorganization of 
the pardon and parole system, equal 
responsibility from both labor and 
management, economy in state gov­
ernment.

ANGELO ICE CO.
ELDORADO

Ice Cream, Milk, Cold Drinks, 
Popsickles, Ice.

Open every day to 10:00 p. m. 

MR. & MRS. R. H. DAMERON

Finish and Self-Seirve 
Across the Street

From Frozen Foods

UPTOWN
LAUNDRY

We’ve Moved!
Our Laundry has been moved from 
Dameron’s to the Patton building- in 
the business district of Eldorado. We 
are ready to serve you with—

WET WASH

ROUGH DRY

FINISHED WORK

Eldorado Laundry
Mrs. Ottaberry Mrs. Wallace

Your Patronage Appreciated

Charter No. 8575 Reserve District No. 11

Report of the Condition of

THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK
OF ELDORADO

in the State of Texas, at the close of business on June 29, 1946, 
Published ,in response to call made by Comptroller of the Currency 
under Section 5211, U. S. Revised Statutes.

ASSETS
1. Loans and discounts (including $227.18 overdrafts)-. 1,146,004.20
2. United States Government obligations, direct and

guaranteed -------------------------------- 1__________________  769,857.18
3. Obligations of States and political subdivisions_____ 4,178.12
5. Corporate stocks (including $4,500.00 stock o f Federal

Reserve b a n k )___ ,_________________________________  4,500.00
6. Cash, balances with other banks, including reserve

balance, and cash items in process o f collection_____  715.373.48
7. Bank premises owned $12,500.00, furniture and fix­

tures $2,821.04 ------------------------------ -------------------------- 15,321.04

12. TOTAL ASSETS ....     2,655,234.02
*

LIABILITIES
13. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and

corporations------------------------------------------------------------  2,068,915.33
14. Time deposits of individuals, partnerships, and cor­

porations ----------------      9,000.00
15. Deposits of United States Government (including

postal savings) -------------------------------------------------------  86,177.05
16. Deposits o f States and political subdivisions__________ 257,064.73
18. Other deposits (certified and cashier’s checks, etc.)___  14,318.74
19. TOTAL D E PO SITS___________________$2,435,475.85

24. TOTAL LIABILITIES _____________________________ 2,435,475.85

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS
25. Capital Stock:

(c) Common stock, total par $75,000.00_____________  75,000.00
26. Surplus ------------------------------------------------------------------  75,000.00
27. Undivided p ro fits_________    69,758.17

29. Total Capital Accounts_____________________________ 219,758.17

30. Total Liabilities and Capital Accounts_____________  2,655,234.02

MEMORANDA
31. Pledged assets (and securities loaned) (book value):

(a) United States Government obligations, direct 
and guaranteed, pledged to secure deposits and other 
liabilities __________________________________________ 140,000.0(

(e) T ota l.................................... ................. ......... ...........  140,000.00

32. Secured liabilities:
(a) Deposits secured by pledged assets pursuant to 
requirement of la w _________________________________  248,218.94

(d) Total .......... - ___________________________ ______  248,218.94

State of Texas, County of Schleicher, ss:
I, W. O. Alexander, Vice-President and cashier ox the above-named 

bank, do solemnly swear that the above statement is true to the best of 
my knowledge and belief.

W. O. ALEXANDER, Vice-Pres. & Cashier.
Correct—Attest:

V. H. Humphrey 
J. B. Christian 
J. E. Hill

Directors.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 
5th day of July, 1946.

Elizabeth Ballew, Notary Public.
(Seal)
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WATER WELL SUPPLIES—WATER WELL CYLINDERS—WELL RODS, galvanized and black, 1 1-8— 1 3-8—1 5-8—ROD RIVETS: Copper, Galv., Black— STEEL TANK TOWERS—WATER PUMP JACKS 
gasoline and electric—GALVANIZED PIPE 1-8 in. to 3*/z— CUP LEATHERS--Cook and Standard, all sizes— best stock south of Angelo— WATER TANKS, galvanized and wood—TANK VALVES—TROUGH 
VALVES — FLOAT PANS — PIPE FITTING OF ALL KINDS FROM l/4 INCH TO 3>/z INCH. —r— ELECTRIC PUMP INSTALLATIONS. SEE US FOR ALL YOUR NEEDS IN THIS LINE

ELDORADO HARDWARE COMPANY — Phone 155
Mr. and Mrs. John McWhorter 

and small daughter of Dallas have 
been visiting here with his mother, 
Mrs. W. L. McWhorter and other 
relatives.

David Gant left Tuesday for his 
home at Oklahoma City, Okla. after 
a visit of two weeks here with his 
uncle and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. C. R. 
Keeney.

ALAMO MOTOR LINES
1 ■ Free Pick-Up & Delivery

DAILY SERVICE TO & FROM 
SAN ANGELO & SAN ANTONIO

Eldorado Phone No. 2

The more than 6,000 
member companies of the 
United States Independent 
Telephone Industry reflect perfectly 
the American ideal of free enterprise. 
These companies serving two-thirds of 
the nation’s area vary in size and scope 
of operation. But all retain their pro­
gressive independence in spirit and 
ownership. We proudly serve you as 
a member of the Independent tele­
phone industry.

Safi Angelo  
Telephone Co.

Personal Items
Mrs. Roberta Thigpen and daugh­

ter, Rose Marie, left Monday for 
Portland, Oregon, after a several 
weeks visit here with her mother, 
Mrs. Judd Brannon and other rela­
tives. Mrs. Thgpen’s other two 
children will remain here with 
their grandmother, Mrs. A. L. Thig­
pen.

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Hoegenauer 
have moved to Junction to make 
their home. Mr. Hogenauer is em­
ployed with the Taylor Construc­
tion Company, and the family have 
been living here in the garage 
apartment at the E. C. Hill home.

Mrs. Arminta Sewell, who has 
been visiting here with friends and 
attending to business, left this week 
for Kerrville where she will be at 
home with her daughter, Mrs. Mad­
eline Slaven. Mrs. Sewell is a for­
mer resident of Schleicher County.

We Are Now

FIRESTONE District DEALER
Firestone tires,, tubes, tractor tires; 

batteries and accessories.
Firestone spark plugs for cars and 

tractors at 59c each.
Tail pipes, mufflers, battery re­

charging.
Veedol 100% Pennsylvania Oil. 
Cosden gas, oil and grease. Whole­

sale and retail. For wholesale delivery 
call 250.

DAVIS
COSDEN SERVICE

Mrs. Max Henry returned last 
week to her home in Alpine after 
visiting here with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. C. C. McLaughlin, and al­
so relieving the regular telephone 
operators while on their vacations. 
Mrs. Henry was accompanied home 
by her mother and brother, Junior, 
who returned home the following 
day.

Mrs. B. E. Moore has gone to 
Brownwood to be with her mother, 
Mrs. G. A. Lewis, who is seriously 
ill there.

J. C. Doyle recently moved from 
Del Rio to Sonora.

Mr. and Mrs. E. C. Gentry and 
Mrs. L. V. Whiteside and son, Hugh 
and daughter, Melba Vee of Cop­
pell, left Monday after spending the 
week end visiting in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Ratliff.

Mrs. J. L. Ratliff, who went to 
San' Angelo recently, expecting to 
have an operation, was sent home 
for further treatment. She will re­
turn next Monday to San Angelo, 
and may remain for the operation if 
she is ready for it.

Mrs. W. B, Averitt and three 
children of Chalk, visited last week 
in the home of her cousin, Mrs. W. 
G. McAlpine and family.

NEW ELECTRIC IRONS while 
they last $5.50 (no heat control)— 
Williams and McAngus Hdw.

Mrs. Jack Elder left Tuesday for 
Temple where she will undergo 
medical examination.

Mrs. Norman Klink and three 
children spent Monday night with 
her father, Tom Smith en route to 
their home at Pecos from Fort 
Worth. Mr. Klink, who suffered a 
broken hand in a recent accident, 
is undergoing surgery at a hospital 
in Fort Worth. He will possibly 
remain there another week.

Robert Isaacs of Austin visited 
here Wednesday and Thursday of 
last week with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Will Isaacs. He was accompan­
ied home by his daughters, Jo and 
Jewell and son, Bob, who have been

Eldorado Motor Co.
F. B. CALCOTE—MAGNOLIA CONSIGNEE 

WHOLESALE DISTRIBUTOR
- — . • . (i

FOR ALL MAGNOLIA PRODUCTS

CALL 132

Complete Repair Department
Tires — Tubes —  Accessories

visiting here with relatives. Ano­
ther daughter, Dolores, remained 
for a longer visit with her grand­
parents.

Major and Mrs. Lester Hodges 
and daughter, Carol, returned Sat­
urday night to her parents’ home, 
Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Taylor of 
San Angelo, after spending several 
days in San Antonio. The other two 
children, Jimmy Lester and Vicki, 
remained here with their uncle and 
aunt, Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Conner 
while their parents were away.

Mrs. William L. Johnson and 
baby son, Roger Lloyd, returned to 
their home at Canyon last Friday, 
after a visit here with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Rodgers. Mr. 
Johnson, who attends school at 
Canyon, came here for his family.

Frank Van Horn, mechanic at the 
Eldorado Motor Company, suffered 
a heart attack last Thursday morn­
ing at his home here. After a rest 
in bed, he was reported to be recov­
ering.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Spurgers of 
McCamey spent the fourth and the 
week end visiting with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Watson and 
with his father, R. C. Spurgers and 
other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Jo Ed Hill have 
bought the Gene Mebane house to 
cated on the San Angelo highway, 
and are moving their household 
goods from Ft. Worth this week. I

Mr. and Mrs. John McLeod of 
Pontotoc and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Conner of Kingsviile returned to 
their homes Monday morning after 
attending the funeral of their moth­
er, Mrs. W. T. Conner Saturday, 
and visiting here with relatives.

Miss Mary Lewis Walker, who is 
employed with the REA at San An­
gelo, spent Saturday and Sunday 
visiting in the home of Mrs. Mar­
garet Tinning.

LAWN CHAIRS—- Canvas backs 
and all-wood styles. Priced from 
$2.25 up at Cameron’s.

Mrs. Ovid Wade and daughter, 
Patsy and - Mrs. Jack Wade and 
son, Jack, visited over the week 
end at Brady with Mrs. Jack 
Wade’s mother and other relatives. 
While there, the group attended 
a home coming at Waldrip.

Mrs. Tom Smith returned home 
Wednesday from a week’s visit in 
Roswell, New Mexico. She was met 
in Ft. Stockton by Mr. Smith, who 
accompanied her home.

Tom Smith, livestock dealer, 
shipped out three loads of sheep 
during the week end. One toad was 
shipped Saturday, and two loads 
Monday, consigned to San Antonio 
and bought from Jack Wade and 
Emil Dannheim.

VOTE AGAIN FOR

Hjggg

JUDGE MALLORY B. BLAIR

Candidate for Re-Election as

ASSOCIATE JUSTICE
COURT OF CIVIL APPEALS

Experienced Twenty-four years 
on the Appellate Bench.

Qualified Endorsed by more than 
80% of the practicing attorneys in 
the 24 counties in the district.

Hard-working Has written 891 
opinions as associate justice, a rec­
ord equalled by few Texas judges.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Clark and Mr. 
and Mrs. Clifton Henderson and 
family attended a reunion of the 
Clark family at Lampasas the past 
week end.

Mr. and Mrs. George Dickens 
visited Sunday and Monday in Men­
ard with their son and daughter- 
in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Jess Dickens 
and other relatives.

I Let Claude Fix It
If it’s broken or won’t run, BRING 

IT TO US!
We can do portable, acetylene and 

electric welding—can repair your farm 
equipment and can overhaul your car! ■

ALEXANDER GARAGE
Congratulations to the Ropers Club

£ W ** ^ * * * ^ "  * 1 f  ' 1-|f»r— W j-i

3 Years To Pay
’ for Butane Installation. 

Tanks available.

TOPLIFFE
Gas and Electric Service

:

Say It With

'Friendly Flowers*
for all your floral needs, call
Mrs. John Isaacs________Phone 181

Local Representative of

The
Friendly Flower Shop

San Angelo

■

:

It’s Time for 
a Change

Your car isn’t getting any younger. 
It needs frequent check-ups.

Let us vacationize your car. Your 
vacation can be ruined with unneces­
sary troubles. So bring us your car. Let 
us change over to summer weight oils 
and give the car a routine check-up.

It may make a lot of difference!

Rock Station No. 1
ARTHUR M ON TG O M ER Y
Humble Products Groceries

Accessories u
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R.J. A D A M S
Of Ozona

Floor Sanding 
and Finishing

WORKING IN ELDORADO THIS 

WEEK AND NEXT WEEK

Call at Cameron Lbr. Co. 
or Foxworth-Galbraith.

£ W * t ^ v

Have it
DYED!

DON’T DISCARD THAT 
FADED DRESS OR SKIRT! 

LET US HAVE IT 
DYED FOR YOU 

AND IT WILL LOOK NEW  
AGAIN!

COULTER’S
Men’s Wear —  Dry Cleaners

:

:

Pat Enochs and wife and daugh­
ter, Patricia of Somerville visited 
relatives in Eldorado recently. They 
also visited at Carlsbad, N. M., 
Camp Wood, and Balmorrhea be­
fore returning home.

Mrs. R. E. Wright, sister of Miss 
Hattie Estes, is in a hospital at 
Temple convalescing from a seri­
ous operation. Mrs. Wright is a 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. J. E. 
Estes.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Dickens 
and family left Sunday for Walsen- 
burg, Colo., where Mr. Dickens is 
delivering a load of stock, a trac­
tor, plow and other tools for Gar­
land Williams. Mr. Williams re­
cently bought a farm near Walsen- 
burg and has moved there to make 
his home.

Jack Buchannan of Dryden is 
visiting here with his uncle and 
aunt, Mr. and Mrs. Carl D. Elling­
ton and family.

The Reynolds Home Demonstra­
tion Club met Monday afternoon in 
the home of Mrs. Ray Bfuton with 
four members present. Plans were 
made for the annual Candidate’s 
Rally and refreshments were served 
by the hostess.

LAWN CHAIRS—  Canvas backs 
and all-wood styles. Priced from 
$2.25 up at Cameron’s.

Bob McWhorter went to the 
Valley last week and brought his 
grandmother, Mrs. J. S. Pelt of 
Edinburgh here for a visit with her 
daughters, Mrs. W. L. McWhorter, 
and Mrs. J. S. Pelt. Mrs. Charley 
Fortson and son, Chartes o f Edin­
burgh, who have also Deen visiting 
here with the McWhorters and 
Whittens, have gone to Dallas for 
a visit there.

W. C. Parks, Sr. of Pyote, spent 
July 4 here with his son, W. C. 
Parks, Jr. and family, and his 
daughters, Mmes. Willard Hum­
phrey, R. J. Alexander, and John 
S. Williams.

Mrs. Hugh Harzke, who recently 
purchased the El Cacti building and 
lot, is having the grounds cleaned 
of weeds and tall grass this week.

ATTEND THE

REVIVAL
AT THE

Church of Christ
IN ELDORADO

July 12 to July 21
PREACHING BY

Leland H. Knight
-  OF BOONEVILLE, ARK.

SERVICES DURING THE WEEK AT 8:30 P. M.

SERVICES SUNDAYS:—
11:00 A. M. PREACHING 

DINNER ON THE GROUND 
8:30 P. M. PREACHING

EVERYBODY INVITED!

Will Neal of Ft. Stockton visited 
several days last week with his sis­
ter, Mrs. Frank Van Horn and fam­
ily.

Mrs. F. B. Calcote directed the 
Bible Study when the Baptist WM 
U met Monday afternoon at the 
church. There were about 20 pre­
sent.

Guests last week in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Truett Stanford were 
Mr. and Mrs. Luther A. Kent of Ty­
ler, and Mr. and Mrs. Buck Kent 
and two children, Jimmy and Mary 
Ann of Monahans. The two families 
have gone to Colorado for their 
vacations.

Mrs. Truett Stanford has receiv­
ed the announcement of the mar­
riage of her niece, Winona Ray 
Alsup, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Alsup of San Antonio, to 
Milton Harper, serving in the Mar­
ines. The couple were married in 
California, Saturday, July 6. Mr. 
Harper’s home is also in San An­
tonio. The bride is well known here, 
having spent one summer in the 
Stanford home.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Parks of 
Mertzon spent Monday night visit­
ing in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Bruton of the Reynolds Com­
munity.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Fowler of 
Eldorado and Mr and Mrs. J. C. 
Young of San Angelo are on their 
way to new York City, on an ex­
tended vacation trip. They expect 
to spend time in New York, Boston 
and other places.

Bill Matteson left Monday morn­
ing for New York as driver for a 
San Angelo party. The group are 
going through by automobile and in 
New York Bill will visit, with his 
sister, Miss Wanda Matteson at 
Schenectady and in other places 
with friends.

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Alexander 
attended a Clark family reunion at 
Lampasas during the week end, and 
visited in Austin before returning 
to Eldorado.

Mrs. A. E. Kent has gone to Nor- 
mangee to attend the annual reun­
ion of the Hill family, of which she 
is a member. En route there, she 
Visited in Abilene with a daughter, 
Miss Pat Kent.

Mortgage Loans
Texas, New Mexico & Arizona 
Ranches, Farms, homes, tourisi 
camps, filling stations, hotels 
store and office buildings. If yor 
have a good loan I can make it

William H. Bickle
Central Nat'l Bank Bldg. San Angelo
Office 6235 Home 5861-3

For The 
F I N E S T

in

Boot & Shoe 
Repair

Mail Orders Given 
Special Attention

M. L. LEDDY
Saddle & Boot Shop
24 S. Chadboume, San Angelo

v_______________ _______________

Eldorado Success
PUBLISHED EVERY FRID AY  

A t Eldorado, Texas
Fred G unstead_________ Publisher
Alice G unstead____________Editor

Entered as Second Class Matter 
at the post office at Eldorado, 
Texas, under the Act of March 3, 
1887.

Any erroneous reflection upon 
the character, standing or reputa­
tion of any person, firm or cor­
poration which may appear in the 
columns of the Success will be 
gladly corrected upon same being 
brought to the attention of the 
publisher.

Notice of entertainments where 
a charge of admission is made, 
obituaries, card of thanks, resolu­
tions of respect, and ail matters 
not news will be charged for at the 
regular rates.

Stetson
Hats
Just received 

nice shipment in 
larger shapes. 

Whites and Browns.

Ratliff Store
ELDORADO, TEXAS 

Owr Prim Am  M« Higher Thaw

t m M j i o E l
217 S. Chadbourna 21 Yaars la So. Angela

Js Cafe
PLATE LUNCHES 

SANDWICHES 
SHORT ORDERS 

COLD DRINKS

For Breakfast: Bacon and eggs, ham 
and eggs, breakfast foods, cof fee, etc
Sunday Hours: 6 a. m. to 2:00 p. m.
Weekday Hours: 6 a. m. to 8:00 p. m.

HOME APPLIANCE CO.
411 S. Chadbourne 

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS
CURTIS SMITH CHARLES RATLIFF

Barn F l y

You have heard of DDT, the "miracle killer." Purina research ha* 
developed a plan for using DDT that b both effective and low cost.

/  P U R IN A  FLY S P R A Y  FOR F A R M  BUILD. 
IN G S . Two applications a  year keep down 
lie s in the bam.

2. P U R IN A  FLY S P R A Y  FO R  D A IR Y  C AT -
TLE. Should flies come Into the bam on the 
cows, this quickly kills and repels them.

* "•••“  " '.y z -

FOR FARM FUN AND MUSIC 
Tune in on Purine’s OPRY HOUSE MATINEE

Your Mutual Station 1 2 :0 0 -1 2 :3 0  CST. —  1 :0 0 -1 :3 0  1ST.

ELDORADO WOOL COMPANY
FEED DEPARTMENT

\
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Mr. and Mrs. C. A. Long are at 
home in an apartment at the Jess 
Bradshaw residence' following their 
return from a wedding trip to Dal­
las. The couple were married JulJ1 
5 in Ballinger. Mrs. Long, the for­

mer Mrs. Polly St. Martin is a 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. J. E. 
Underwood of Ballinger. Mr. Long 
is a surveyor here with the Atlas 
Exploration Company.

First National Bank :

Officers and Employees
J. B. Christian______________ President ,
J. E. Hill_______________ Vice President
W. 0. Alexander______ V.P. & Cashier
Leslie B aker___________Ass’t Cashier
John W. Alexander____ ___Bookkeeper
Sarah H ill________________ Bookkeeper

—  i
Banking Hours

Week Days_____ _9:00 a. m. to 3:00 p. m. ;
Saturdays________9:00 a.m. to 12 Noon

Total Resources Over $2,000,000.00

PERSONAL SHOPPING 
SERVICE. . . .

When not convenient to shop in person, use our mail service. 
Mail orders given personal, prompt attention.

C^%i4fiî QrcerCo.
“ Serving West Texas Since 1913v 

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS.

Mrs. Brodie 

the Budget!
"Y o u  have to be a trained seal to balance a budget these 

days!”  complains M rs. Brodie.
"Everything costs so much! Take clothing— when you can 

iet it,”  says Mrs. Brodie, "an d  look at the price tags! And  
:ood— that’s simply skyrocketed! House furnishings— if you 

can find a house to furnish— are way u p !”
K

"B u t not electricity!”  says Mrs. Brodie. "N o , indeed!” says 
Mrs. Brodie.

'Electricity
has been

coming down
steadily

for years!"

"Electricity,” says Mrs. Brodie, "is  just about the easiest 
thing in my budget to balance!”

I f you have a budget to balance— and who hasn’t?— you’ll 
appreciate that the low cost of electricity is no accident. It took 
plenty o f practical planning and experience on the part of the 
folks in this company who— like Mrs. Brodie— have budgets 
to balance, too.

Wfest Texas Utilities 
Company

||<rj

I( ■ ■

-iC.

1  M M m

r J p .

Wanda Matteson

Wanda Matteson 
Wedding Date is Set

Mrs. E. H. Coulter has an­
nounced the engagement and ap­
proaching marriage of her daugh­
ter, Miss Wanda Lea Matteson, and 
Raymond Sherrard, Jr., son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Sherrard of 
New Orleans, La.

The wedding will take place Aug­
ust 17 at Saint John the Evange­
list in Schnectady, N. Y.

Miss Matteson is a graduate of 
the Eldorado High School. She is a 
former resident of San Angelo and 
attended the high school and the 
Junior College there. She is a grad­
uate of Sul Ross College, Alpine 
She taught chemistry one year in 
Ballinger High School and for the 
past two years has been employed 
as a chemist at the General Electric 
Company in Schenectady, N. Y.

Mr. Sherrard is employed as an 
engineer in the Schenectady Works 
of the General Electric Company. 
He was formerly an instructor at 
Tulane University from which he 
graduated in 1942.

Shivers Discusses Platform
Senator Allan Shivers, only ex- 

serviceman in the race for Lieuten­
ant Governor, focused attention on 
war veterans when he opened his 
campaign recently in his home 
town, Port Arthur.

“ I exchanged ideas with fighting 
men many times in the hard days 
overseas in Africa, Italy, France 
and Germany. I know the anxiety 
and disappointment so many veter­
ans feel today, and I understand 
and appreciate their problems that 
are also my problems,”  the Jeffer­
son County senator stated.

Although only 38 years old, Sena­
tor Shivers is dean of Texas Sen­
ate because of his 12 years service 
there. The Gulf Coast counties of 
Jefferson, Hardin, Liberty and 
Orange made him the youngest 
senator ever to take the oath of 
office when he was first sent to the 
state capitol to represent them in 
1934.

“ My past 12 years experience in 
the state senate enables me to pre­
side over the legislative body, 
which is one o f the main duties of 
Lieutenant-Governor,”  Senator 
Shivers pointed out.

Listed as his aims when elected 
Lieutenant-Governor, Senator Shiv­
ers named consideration of war 
veterans’ problems, higher salaries' 
for teachers, better farm-to-market 
roads, reorganization o f the pardon 
and parole system of the state.

He pointed out that he proposed 
and sponsored a farm-to-market 
road program for every county ift 
Texas during the last session of the 
legislature. “ The first old-age 
assistance law placed upon the Tex­
as Statutes was sponsored by Allan 
Shivers,” he reminded.

“ I have been a proponent of leg­
islative redistricting since 1937. 
This must be done and Real soon,”  
the senator said, continuing his 
platform. “ I favor a 60-day session 
of the legislature each year rather 
than 120 days every other year. I 
also favor a reduction in the num­
ber of legislators and adequate pay 
for them,’ ’ he stated.

Now touring the state in the in­
terest of his candidacy, the senator 
stated he is asking for promotion 
upon the basis that he is the only 
candidate for Lieutenant-Governor 
who has the experience and qualifi­
cations that are so badly needed in 
order to properly preside over the 
Texas Senate, the Lieutenant-Gov­
ernor’s chief function.

FLOWER SHOP MOVED
The Friendly Flower Shop of 

San Angelo, which is represented 
here by the Woman’s Society of 
Christian Service of the Methodist 
'Church, has moved from 1321 South 
Oakes to new and larger quarters 
located at 1119 South Oakes.

The shop is now featuring a lar­
ger and more complete stock of 
flowers and other merchandise. 
Herschel Summerlin, co-owner 
stated that almost double the for­
mer floor space is now available, 
with a cold storage vault three 
three times larger. Personnel has 
been increased to six employees.

T. H. McCreery is co-owner with 
Summerlin of the Friendly Flower 
Shop, which was established about 
twenty months ago.

Billy McCravey and Pancho 
Bradley are operating a waterme­
lon stand at Christoval. They re­
ported a rush of business on the 
fourth.

Flowers
FOR ALL OCCASIONS

POT PLANTS or CUT FLOWERS 

CORSAGES 

Call
MRS. H. T. FINLEY—PHONE 159

Representative of 

Walker Morgan Flower Shop

'

:

HAVE YOUR WATCH 
REPAIRED BY

JOHN STIGLER
Jeweler

Watches, .Diamonds, Jewelry 
Christoval, Texas.

ELDORADO 
LODGE 

A . F. & A . M, 
No. 890

Stated MvetLig 
Second Saturday 

light In each month.
Visiting Brethem Welcome

TexacoServiceStation
Your Texaco & Firestone Dealer

Let us keep your car in shape with Texaco 
Products: Havoline and Texaco Motor 
Oils — Marfak Lubrication r— Fire Chief 
and Sky Chief Gasoline. Also white gaso­
line, kerosene and windmill oil — Grease 
for farming purposes.

Washing — Polishing and Simonizing. 
Spark plug testing and cleaning, Battery 
Charging. Tailpipes — Mufflers — Floor 
Mats — Mud Chains — Hydraulic Bumper 
Jacks—General line of accessories & parts

Plenty of

Firestone
Batteries—Tubes—Fan Belts—Brake 
Fluid — SparkPlugs — A good line of 
accessories—and Seat Covers— - Come in 
and let us fit your car with a set.

You’re Always Welcome At Our Station.

MR. AND MRS. A. G. CLARK
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Williams & McAngus
Hardware

Galvanized Pipes 
y* to 21/* inch.

Guns and Pistols 
Waste Paper Baskets 

Clothes Baskets 
New Stock Granite Ware 

Electric Razors 
Electric Air Conditioners 

Lawn Furniture

YES,
WE DO PLUMBING

/*-------------------------------------------------------------->
GARDEN SEED COFFEE POTS

FLOOR LAMPS

AMMUNITION
BOOMERS

WINDMILLS TOWERS
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COMPANY REPORTS 
SUBSTANTIAL GAIN

A business gain of 43% for the 
first six months of 1946 for the 
Southwestern Life Insurance Com­
pany is indicated in information 
received here today from C. F. 
O’Donnell of Dallas, president, by 
the Company’s paid-for business 
ur the period amounted to $44,505,- 

0, President O’Donnell’s an- 
kuncement said.

The Company’s gain in insurance 
in force of $31,220,000 for the first 
half of the year is the largest such 
gain for any similar six-month per­
iod since organization of the Com­
pany.

REVIVAL AT CHURCH OF 
CHRIST

The public is again reminded of 
the revival which will open at the 
South Side Church of Christ Friday 
evening, July 12. Leland H. Knight 
of Booneville, Ark. will hold ser­
vices each evening at 8:30 o’clock 
and on Sundays at .11:00 a. m. din­
ner will be served on the grounds.

The revival will close Sunday, 
July 21.

BRIDGE CLUB MEETS
Mr. and Mrs. H. T. Finley were 

hosts to the Friday Night Bridge 
Club Wednesday evening with a 
barbecue supper in their tack yard 
followed by several bridge games.

Prizes were awarded as follows: 
Jimmy West, high club; Jack Shu- 
gart, high guest; Bingo, Mrs. Leslie 
Baker and Archie Mittel; cut, Mrs. 
W. R. Bearce, and travelling prize, 
Jimmy West.

Those present were Messers, and 
Mmes. West, C. C. McLaughlin, 
Baker, Carroll White, Bearce, 
members. Guests were Mr. and 
Mrs. Carroll Ratliff, Ozona; Mr. 
and Mrs. Archie Mittel, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Shugart and Mr. and 
Mrs. Edward Meador.

Other supper guests included Mr. 
and Mrs. W. F. Meador and Billy 
Frank, Mr. and Mrs. C. L. Meador, 
Jr., Mrs. Luke Thompson and Mrs. 
Lewis Ballew.

HERE FROM FORT WORTH
Mrs. J. M. Hays and Frankie 

Thompson, who are taking music at 
the Seminary at Ft. Worth, visited 
from Thursday night until Sunday 
with their families. They were met 
in San Angelo Thursday evening by 
Mr. and Mrs. Jess Thompson, Mary 
Thompson and Rev. Hays.

Marguerite and Louise Treadwill 
of Ft. Worth came in Friday night 
for a short visit with Mrs. Hays and 
Frankie, and the group returned to 
Ft. Worth Sunday night after ser­
vices, accompanied there by Rev. 
Hays. On Saturday evening, the 
visitors were honored with a barbe­
cue supper on the lawn at the Bust­
er Gunn residence. The Thompsons 
and the Hays were assisted in serv­
ing by several friends. About 30 
attended.

PRESBYTERIAN AUXILIARY 
Mrs. A. J. Butler was the pro­

gram leader when the Ladies Aux­
iliary met Monday afternoon at 
the Presbyterian Church. Mrs. Ed­
win Jackson gave the devotional 
and the subject of the piogram was 
“ We Found What We Need.”

Mrs. R. J. Page was hostess and 
served refreshments ■ to 13 members 
and one visitor, Mrs. Billie Eaton 
of San Antonio.

BUYS HOME
D. Ashmore, Eldorado barber, 

Wide a deal this week for the pur­
chase of the Forrest Alexander 
residence, located on the Angelo 
highway near the school house.

Eldred Roach and Pancho Brad­
ley have returned from a business 
trip to Houston.

Col. and Mrs. R. F. Frost and 
children made a business trip to 
San Antonio Tuesday.

S T O C K E ^ N  SAVE!
O ur 75c  bottle of D U R H A M 'S  
P IN K  EYE P R E S C R IP T IO N  con­
tains four times as much powder as 
most $1.00 brands and is ab so ­
lutely guaranteed to relieve Pink 
Eye— or your money back.

Hoover Drug Store, Eldorado

Mrs. Palmer West and Riedale 
spent Wednesday visiting in Son­
ora with Mrs. West’s sister, Mrs. 
C. W. Taylor.

Penrose B. Metcalfe, candidate- 
for re-election to the state senate, 
was calling on Eldorado voters yes­
terday.

Mrs. West Pool and granddaugh­
ter, Linda Pool of Girvin spent July 
4 visiting in the homes o f Mrs. 
Pool’s daughters, Mrs. W. E. Turn- 
bow and Mrs Eldon Turnbow. They 
were accompanied here by Mr. and 
Mrs. Alan Mitchell of Crane, who 
visited in the home of Mrs. Mit­
chell’s brother-in-law and sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. H. L. Turnbow. Guests 
Sunday in the Turnbow home were 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Turnbow and 
daughter, Opal and granddaughter, 
Penny of Borger.

Stokes Williams of Mertzon was 
a business visitor in town Thurs­
day.

Mrs. S. E. Jones and Mrs. John 
Williams will attend a barbecue at 
the Christian Church at Brady 
Sunday which will mark the close 
of a meeting there.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Tom Roach are 
the parents of a boy born at 1:15 
a. m. today, July 11. The baby 
weighed nine pounds. The maternal 
grandmother is Mrs. Essie Brasher 
of Brownwood and paternal grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. A. J. 
Roach of Eldorado. The baby was 
bom at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Roach.

C. A. Reynolds, who is attending 
school at Alpine, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Max Henry of Alpine will come in 
today (Thursday) for a visit of a 
few days at home. Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry will visit with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. C. McLaughlin. 
Supt. Reynolds’ family, who are 
visiting with relatives, will be home 
the 18th.

Mrs. J. T. Ballew of San Angelo 
is visiting this week with her child­
ren, Mrs. Van McCormick, Lionell, 
Lewis, and G. L. Ballew.

H. D. Bradley and wife of Wau- 
rika, Oklahoma, visited Tuesday of 
this week with the F. M. Bradley 
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Eldon Turnbow 
will leave Friday for San Angelo 
where Mrs. Turnbow will undergo 
surgery at the St. John’s hospital 
there Saturday. Her mother, Mrs. 
West Pool of Girvin will be here to 
stay with the family while Mrs. 
Turnbow is in the hospital.

WASHINGTON NEWS LETTER
By Congressman'Fisher

The big news in Washington last 
week, as was true over the nation, 
was price levels with controls taken 
off. A survey made in grocery 
stores here showed some increases, 
a few decreases, and many things 
selling for about the same. For 
weeks there has been practically 
no meat sold in stores, but it is 
reported the big rushes in the 
stockyards will be reflected in meat 
counters very shortly. Most com­
plaints here have been concerned 
with increases in rents.

The price of meat will, of course, 
be higher. This is true because of 
removal of ceilings and also be­
cause of removal of consumer sub­
sidies. The subsidy is a hidden cost 
the consumer has been paying all 
along but without it being shown 
in his grocery bill each week. The 
same is true of milk and a number 
of other commodities. In Washing­
ton, milk jumped three cents a bot­
tle immediately, but it really was 
not an increase after all, because 
the three cents equalled the subsidy 
the government has been paying oh 
each bottle of milk purchased by 
the consumer, and is usually refer­
red to as a “ hidden cost.” In the 
case of meat, the government- has 
been paying about a nickel a pound 
on the consumers’ bill.

All in all, during the past four 
years, Uncle Sam has spent a total 
of six and a half billion dollars in 
helping to pay grocery bills of Am­
erican consumers. That is, of, 
course, not a real saving to the 
housewife because the money used 
for that purpose has been borrowed 
by the government, with interest, 
and the consumers will eventually 
have to foot the bill anyway. At 
2% %  interest this accumulated 
bill will continue to cost us 162.5 
million dollars every year until the 
bonds are paid off, and this will 
require years and years.

=r

Modern Gas and Electric Ranges Stress Convenience

W HETHER you buy a gas or electric range, you’ll r 
find that each has special advantages, Joan | 

Miller tells rural homemakers in nationally circulated 1 
Capper’s Farmer.

‘ ‘Whichever type you select,”  she writes in the 
farm magazine read by 1,250,000 rural families, “ you

< »

will find that generally the new 
ranges are convenient for quick 
meal preparation. They are good 
looking pieces of equipment which 
are easily kept clean.

Purchasing a range made by an 
established, reliable company is 
your insurance of a good quality 
product, she continues. But it pays 
to notice or ask about these con­
struction points:

Top-of-range burners or heating 
units should be spaced far enough 
apart so they’ll accommodate large 
pans or kettles.

The oven should be placed where 
most convenient to reach and use.

The broiler also should be con­
veniently located for placement of 
food.

For ease in cleaning, look for 
porcelain enamel, inside and out.

A deep-well cooker plus large unit and two of average 
siie give ample space for meal preparation on top of 
electric range shown above. Automatic timer may be 
set to snap oven heat on and off. Staggered automatic­
lighting burners, including an extra-large one, are a 
feature on range for either gas or liquefied gas shown 
at left. Broiler has metal tray which may be used for 
serving.

Toe space is important at bottom 
front edge of range for greater com­
fort when standing in front of it.

In gas ranges look for Certified 
Performance models which are au­
tomatic.

In liquefied gas ranges, check on 
whether the specified fuel has been 
odorized. This makes for easy de­
tection of leaks.

IN THE MATTER OF THE QUARTERLY REPORT OF

Mrs. Mabel Parker
Treasurer Schleicher County, Texas,

IN THE COMMISSIONERS’ COURT, SCHLEICHER COUNTY, TEXAS 

JULY 8th TERM, 1946

On this 8tls day of July A. D., 1946, in Regular Session of the Commissioners’ Court 
of Schleicher County, Texas, came on for examination the Quarterly Report of Mrs. 
Mabel Parker, Treasurer of Schleicher County, Texas, for the period beginning on the 
1st day of April A. D. 1946, and ending on the 30th day of June A. D. 1946, filed 
herein on the 2nd day of July A. D. 1946, and the same having been compared and 
examined by the Court, and found to be correct, IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED by the 
Court that the same be and is hereby approved, and it appearing to the Court that 
during said time the said County Treasurer had received for account and credit of, and 
paid out of each of the several County funds, the amount set forth, and leaving 
balance to each of said funds, as follows, to-wit:

Amount balance to credit of the Jury Fund as per last report.. 
Amount received since last report

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report_____
Leaving and showing to credit o f Jury Fund on

June 30, 1946, a balance o f ____________________

Amount to credit of the Road and Bridge Fund No. 1 as per last report_
Amount received since last rep ort____________________________________

Total “ Cr." as shown by current report_____
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report_________
Leaving and showing to credit of R. and B. Fund No. 1, on 

June 30, 1946, a balance o f ________________________

Amount to credit o f the Road and Bridge Fund No. 2 as per last report- 
Amount received since last rep ort____________________________________

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report 
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report__
Leaving and showing to credit of R. and B. Fund No. 2, on 

June 30, 1946, a balance o f _______________________

Amount to credit o f the Road and Bridge Fund No. 3 as per last report —
—  Amount received since last re p o rt-----------------------------------------------------------

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report--------------------------------
555 Amount paid out and disbursed since last report__________________________

Leaving and showing to credit of R. and B. Fund No. 3, on 
June 30, 1946, a balance o f -----------------------------------

Amount to credit of the Road and Bridge Fund No. 4 as per last report-
Amount received since last report-------------------------------------------------------

Total ‘ ,Cr.”  as shown by current rep ort--------------------------
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report
Leaving and showing to credit of R. and B. Fund No. 4, on 

June 30, 1946, a balance o f ________________________

Amount balance to credit of the General Fund as per last report.
Amount received since last rep ort____________________ _________

Total “ Cr.” as shown by current report___ I-------
Amount paid out and disbursed since last rep ort_______________
Leaving and showing to credit of General Fund on

June 30, 1946, a balance o f ______________________________

Amount balance to credit of the Road Bond Interest Fund as per last report
Amount received since last report ------------- ,-------------------------------------------

Total “ Cr.’ ’ as shown by current rep ort-------------------------------
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report.
Leaving and showing to credit o f Road Bond Interest Fund on 

June 30, 1946, a balance o f __ ;________________________

Amount balance to credit of the Court House Int. Fund as per last report
Amount received since last report------------------------------------------------------------

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current rep ort____________________
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report
Leaving and showing to credit of Court House Interest Fund, on 

June 30, 1946, a balance of.,_____________________________

Amount balance to credit of the Permanent Improvement Fund as 
per last re p o r t---------- --------------------------------------------------------

Amount received since last report-----------------------------
“ Total “ Cr." as shown by current report

: r  Amount paid out and disbursed since last report
Leaving and showing to credit of Permanent Improvement Fund, on 

June 30, 1946, a balance o f ---------------------------------------------------

Amount balance to credit of the Road Warrants Fund as per last report.. 
Amount received since last report

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report - 
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report-------
Leaving and showing to credit of Road Warrant Fund 

June 30, 1946, a balance o f ------------------------------

1779.46 =
5.86 ~

1785.35
652.07 =

1133.28 =

1676.63 jH
2060.05 ==
3736.68 =
2567.98 EE

1168.70 5 5

4180.66 EE
1130.05 ==
5310.71 EE 

610.63

4700.08

6779.12 =
1030.05 
7809.17

915.10

6894.07 5 5

810.75 5 =
1030.05 =E
1840.80 5 5
1153.65 ==

687.15

11,332.11 EE
113.96 5 5

11,446.07 =
3,895.56

7,550.51 H

396.82 EE
None ==

396.82 EE
1.81 5 5

395.01 =

11,565.49 =
29.27 EE

11,594.76
62.16 =

11,532.60 ==

5272.91 EE
43.89 EE

5316.80 ==
2085.71 EE

3231.09 5 5

3004.26 ! |
375.34 ==

3379.60
42.09 EE

3337.51 5 5

Amount balance to credit of the Road & Bridge Special Fund
as per last report---------------------------------------------------------------------------  7.50

Amount received since last rep ort------------------------------------------------------------ 42.43
Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report-------------------------------- 49.93

Amount paid out and disbursed since last report---------------------------------------  None
Leaving and showing to credit of Road and Bridge Special Fund

June 30, 1946, a balance o f ________________________________________  49.93

Amount balance to credit of the 1945 Road Bond Fund as per last report.—.  47,407.88
Amount received since last report-------------------------------------------------------------  None

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report______________________  47,407.88
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report--------------------------------------  645.71
Leaving and showing to credit of 1945 Road Bond Fund

June 30, 1946, a balance o f ________________________________________  46.762.17

And that said amounts were received and paid out of each o f the respective funds 
since the filing of the preceding Quarterly Reports o f said County Treasurer, and dur­
ing the period above stated, and that the said separate amounts as therein shown are 
correct. IT IS THEREFORE FURTHER ORDERED by the Court, that the said de­
tailed report be, and the same is hereby, in all things approved, and the Clerk o f this 
Court is hereby ordered to enter the said report, together with this order, upon the 
Minutes of the Commissioners' Court of Schleicher County, Texas, and that proper 
credits be made in the accounts o f the County Treasurer in accordance with this order.

Witness our hands, this 8th day of July A. D. 1946.
C. L. MEADOR, Jr., County Judge.

C. A. GRAVES, Commissioner Prect. No. 1.
JNO. I. KING, Commissioner Prect. No. 2

PAT MARTIN, Commissioner Prect. No. 3
J. A. ENOCHS, Commissioner Prect. No. 4.
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WRIGHT’S CASH STORE
Eldorado, Texas

Where you meet with quality merchandise 
at fair prices. Each item carries its own 
burden. No item is hiked to meet the cost 
of another.
Fresh sweet milk from the farm, quart 15c
Gandy’s pasteurized milk, quart — 22c
Our present stock of flour will be sold at 
the old price. All new flour will be at an 
advanced price.
No merchandise now in stock will be 
advanced in price, but prices will rise as 
new merchandise arrives.
Owing to the higher cost of cattle and hogs 
meat is bound to increase some in price, 
but will not reach the black market price 
of $6.00 a steak.
Do not buy it because you think there will 
be a shortage. Buy it because you need it.
Internationa] binder twine. If you buy now 
the old prewar price of 6.80 will get it. If we 
have to buy new stocks,, it will probably be 
higher. Feed sacks are also available now. 
Buy them while they are available.

Get Your Car 
Ready to Go!
GET YOUR RADIATOR FLUSHED 
WITH MOBIL RADIATOR FLUSH!

Mobil
Tires 0*

Mobil
Tubes

We Carry DDT 3 Percent 
Household Spray

WAGLEY’S 
MAGNOLIA STATION

Phone 194
ELDORADO, TEXAS

COOPER
SERVICE STATION

-----------featuring-----------

COOPER TIRES & TUBES 

and

GULF PRODUCTS

MUFFLERS —  TAIL PIPES 

CAR WASHING & GREASING

WE HAVE A  FEW 900x20 

ALL-RUBBER TRUCK TUBES

Metcalf Guest At 
Lions Club Meeting

Penrose Metcalf, candidate for 
State Senator, re-election, was 
guest speaker at the regular meet­
ing of the Lions Club Wednesday. 
Mr. Metcalf discussed the State tax 
money, explaining where it comes 
from, its disposition and other im­
portant details interesting to the 
average citizen.

In the business session, with 
Jimmy West, newly installed pres­
ident, a program committee was 
appointed, and final details were 
worked out for the bitterweed pull­
ing scheduled for Monday and the 
Air Show to be staged July 28.

Joe Lawrence was introduced as 
a new member.

INTERMEDIATE GIRL 
SCOUTS MEET

The Intermediate Girl Scouts 
held a one day camp at the home 
of their sponsor, Mrs. Bethel Jef­
frey, recently. Four girls were pre­
sent including Greta Mund, Pansy 
Ruth Owens, Billie Jo Jeffrey and 
Corena Lee Burk.

We came at 9:30 a. m. and left 
at 4:00 p. m. We re-spaced and re­
decorated a room and papered an­
other one to complete work on two 
badges. We cooked our own dinner 
consisting of weiners, steak, melon, 
bananas, fruit cocktail and cookies, 
and we enjoyed two cases of soda 
pop. The July dues were collected.

The next meeting will be on Sat­
urday, July 13 at 3:00 p. m. at Mrs. 
Jeffrey’s house. All girls who have 
not paid their dues are asked to do 
so at this time. —(Reporter.

NEW SHIPMENT of Emerson 
Radios. Topliffe Gas and Electric 
Company. c

____  I

Mrs. Don McCormick and daugh­
ter, Donna Beth, have returned 
from a visit of several days with 
relatives. In Ballinger they visited 
with Mrs. McCormick’s sister, Mrs. 
S. E. Davis and family, and in Abil­
ene with another sister, Mrs. Gen­
eva Johnson. En route home, they 
also visited in San Angelo with a 
brother, Ray Boyer and family. 
Mr. McCormick returned Wednes­
day from a trip to Austin where he 
attended to business connected with 
the R E A  with which he is imploy- 
ed.

Ranch Home Burns 
Saturday Afternoon

The ranch home of Mr. and Mrs. 
O. L. Woodward about 21 miles 
northwest of town was destroyed 
by fire late Saturday afternoon. 
Entire contents of the house toge­
ther with all of the clothing of the 
family was a total loss.

The family had been in town and 
Mr. Woodward was returning home 
leaving his wife in town. A thun­
derstorm with a great deal of light­
ning had come up, and he said that 
on approaching the house he notic­
ed that it was in flames. He reached 
there too late to save anything. It 
is believed by Mr. Woodward that 
lightning was the cause of the fire.

The loss was not covered by in­
surance.

$3 MILLION FOR
SCHOOL LUNCHES ,
IN TEXAS IN ‘46

The Texas school lunch program 
will receive more than $3 million 
next year under the National School 
Lunch Act recently signed by Pres­
ident Truman.

Dr. L. A. Woods, State Superin­
tendent of Public Instruction, has 
announced that the State Depart­
ment of Education has executed 
an agreement with the U. S. De­
partment of Agriculture in accord­
ance with the National School 
Lunch Act.

vWallis Cozzens and Bob Bradley 
accompanied by Mrs. B. O. Bridge- 
man and sons, Willie and Punk, 
left this week for Lubbock where 
Wallis and Boh will investigate the 
possibilities of entering school 
there, and from there Wallis will 
go on to Jamesville, Minnesota 
where he will visit with his brother, 
Homer G. Cozzens until school 
opens in the fall. Willie Bridgeman 
went on to California and Mrs. 
Bridgeman and Punk will visit in 
Kress with her parents before re­
turning home.

Mrs. J. R. Paul returned home 
this week from a visit in Ft. Worth, 
Monahans and Lubbock with her 
sons and sisters, and other rela­
tives.

NEW SHIPMENT of Emerson 
Radios. Topliffe Gas and Electric 
Company. c

FROZEN FOODS CO.

Yellow Cling PEACHES, gal. can ____1.15
• *

VIENNA SAUSAGE, 11 oz_________ 35c

PRUNE JUICE, Q uart___________ 29c

Del Monte COFFEE, 1 Lb__________ 28c
PHILLIPS,, Beans with Franks______ 19c
CIGARETTES, popular brands, ctn. 1.62
WEED KILLER, 4 gal. m ix________ 50c

SOAP POWDER, 24 oz_______________15c

 ̂DORIS Bar s o a p ______________ 6 for 25c

SWEET POTATOES, No. 2% can____ 23c

FROZEN FOODS
• Frozen in Sugar Syrup

STRAWBERRIES — APRICOTS — 
CHERRIES — MIXED FRUIT

AND PINEAPPLE

Cocoanut — Dates —  Peas —  Spinach 
Green Beans —  Rhubarb

PRINTING
Your printing jobs 

receive careful and 

prompt attention 

at the

SUCCESS
Schleicher County
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