
Games Will Highlight Schleicher County Days
Plans have been finalized for the 

games and contests to be held along 
with Schleicher County Days. It will 
be necessary to register for each 
contest at least 30 minutes before the 
contest is scheduled to begin. A 
registration table will be set up 
inside the Memorial Building for 
registration and entry fees. Mrs. 
Anne Hyde will be in charge of 
registration. All of the following 
events will take place on the court­
house lawn or parking lot in front of 
the Memorial Building. The follow­
ing contests will be held:

1. Ladies’ washer toss, ladies’ 
horse shoe pitch, mens’ washer toss 
and mens’ horse shoe pitch.

Candy Richards is serving as 
chairman of these four events. They 
will start at 11 a.m. so you need to be 
there by 10:30 a.m. to register. 
Entry fee is one dollar per person. 
Two people need to enter as a team.

We still need quite a bit of help 
with these categories so if you are 
willing to help, please call Candy 
Richards.

2. The second contest, Jalapena 
Pepper Eating, will start at 12 noon 
on the sidewalk behind the Memorial 
Building. T.P. Robinson is serving 
as the chairman of this event for the

second year.
3. Following a delicious lunch we 

hope to have a large number of 
entries in the Tobacco Spitting 
Contest. Johnny Griffin has once 
again agreed to be chairman. Entry 
fee is one dollar per person. There 
will be age divisions for the contest 
this year, ten years of age and 
younger, 11-16 years of age and 16 
years and older.

This contest will start promptly at 
1 p.m. Entrants need to bring their 
own tobacco. Trophies will be 
awarded in each age division.

4. At 1:30 p.m. we will have the 
first Cow-chip throwing contest with 
Jimmy Martin serving as chairman. 
This contest will be determined on 
accuracy rather than distance. A 
bulls-eye will be placed on the 
ground and the chip landing closest 
to the bulls-eye will win the contest. 
Jimmy has very graciously offered to 
furnish the cow-chips so all you have 
to do is register by 1 p.m. Entry fee 
for this contest is one dollar per 
person. Trophies will be awarded to 
the winners.

5. Starting at 2:30 p.m. Jerry 
Swift will again be running the toe 
sack races. There is no entry fee for 
this event and it will be run by age

Booths Feature Many 
Unique, Fun Items

Lovers of handmade work, ceram­
ics, paintings and wood work should 
enjoy the arts and crafts fair part of 
Schleicher County Days this Satur­
day.

Twenty-two booths will be fea­
tured in the annual event and will 
include two booths with handmade 
items such as crochet, sewing items, 
and needlepoint, one with woodwork 
and glass items, four with oil 
paintings, one with water color, 
three with ceramics, one with quilted 
displays, one with pencil sketches, 
one with carpet wall hangings, and 
one with jewelry and stones.

One of the biggest features will be 
oil paintings by Lorenzo Castañedo 
who was here last year. His 
paintings are all Western art.

Another big feature will be clocks 
made out of cow and ram skulls.

For anyone who gets hungry, 
there will be several food booths. 
Eleanor Jeffrey will be selling barbe­
cue, the Lions Club will be selling 
hamburgers and hot dogs and the 
Overall Cookers will be selling 
barbecue. Beta Sigma Phi Sorority 
will be selling cokes, tea and 
lemonade and the Student Council 
will also sell cokes.

divisions starting out with five year 
olds up to 14 years and older. A 
first, second and third place ribbon 
will be awarded all contestants. You 
do not have to pre-register for this 
contest.

6. The tricycle set is encouraged 
to bring their tricycles for the first 
annual tricycle race. Bob Lester will 
be serving as chairman of this event. 
There will be categories for three, 
four, and five year olds. This race 
will be run in front of the Memorial 
Building. There is no entry fee and 
ribbons will be awarded to the first, 
second, and third place winners in 
each category as well as participant 
ribbons to all contestants. This is the 
first year for this event. You do not 
need to pre-register for this contest.

7. Due to popular demand, 
Richard McCarson has agreed to be 
chairman of the “ ugly-face” contest.
There will be four age divisions for 

this contest: eight years and
younger, 9-12 yrs.; 13-16 yrs. and 17 
and older. The object of the contest 
is to see who can make the ugliest 
face. Richard has promised to come

up with some qualified judges. 
Ribbons will be awarded to the first, 
second, and third place winners in 
each category and participant 
ribbons will be awarded to all con­
testants. There is no entry fee for 
this contest and you do not have to
pre-register.

8. Immediately following the 
“ ugly face’’ contest, Larry Mitchell 
will be chairman of the bubble gum 
blowing contest. There will be four 
age divisions for this contest: eight 
years and younger, 9-12 years, 13-16 
years and 17 and older. You do not 
have to pre-register for this contest. 
There is no entry fee. Ribbons will 
be awarded to all first, second, and 
third place winners as well as 
participant ribbons for all contes­
tants. The ugly-face contest and 
bubble gum blowing contest will be 
held on the sidewalk behind the 
Memorial Building.

9. The final contest for the day 
will be the “ tug-of-war” . This 
contest is for teams of four and will 
be divided into a men’s and ladies’ 
division. Entry fee for the contest is

50 cents per person or $2.00 per 
team. Kerry Joy will be serving as 
chairman of this event. You do need 
to register for this contest by 1 p.m.

so that the registration booth can be 
closed. Trophies and ribbons will be 
awarded to the winning teams.

Who in Eldorado has any talent? 
That question will be answered 
during the talent show sponsored by 
the local chapter of Beta Sigma Phi 
Sorority at Schleicher County Days 
Saturday. ,

There will be three age groups, 
children through 12 years of age, 
adults up to 65 years of age and 
senior citizens aged 65 and older.

The show will begin at 10 a.m. 
with the youngest age group and the 
adults will perform after dinner.

Trophies will be awarded in each 
age category.

We really appreciate Candy Rich­
ards, T.P. Johnson, Johnny Griffin 
and Jerry Swift, who are serving as 
contest chairmen for the second year 
and our new chairmen, Kerry Joy. 
Richard McCarson, Larry Mitchell, 
Jimmy Martin and Bob Lester. All 
residents in the community are 
urged to participate.

An entry fee of three dollars per 
individual and five dollars per group 
will be charged.

Judges will be Jerry Jackson of 
Hobbs, N.M., Benny Logan and Pat 
Ragsdale, both of Eldorado.

Anyone interested in taking part in 
the talent contest should contact 
Sherry Martin at 853-2526, Barbara 
Jackson at 853-2035, Mary Nolen at 
853-2604 and Vicki Duhon at 853- 
2139.

At press time, several local young­
sters had registerd to enter the talent 
show.

Talent Show 1$ Planned
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Bunny Hop 
Is Added

Looking For Queen Contstants

Jaycees Working On Rodeo
Still another “ fun thing” has 

been added to Schleicher County 
Days Saturday-a bunny hop, which 
is a children’s version of armadillo 
races run by adults.

Both of the animals will be put in a 
long cage and their “ renters” will 
encourage them to get to the end of 
the cage first. Bunnies will be 
rented for 50 cents each and entry 
fees are 50 cents per contestant.

The animals are provided by Sam 
Lewis and Associates of San Angelo.

Activities for the second annual 
event will begin at 10 a.m. when the 
arts and crafts fair opens and 
registration begins for washer and 
horseshoe tosses.

The talent show for youngsters 
begins at 10:30 a.m.

The entire event is being spon­
sored by members of the Schleicher 
County Progress Council which will 
have a meeting at noon Thursday 
(today) at the Dairy Mart for final 
arrangments. During their meeting 
last week, members decided to 
purchase additional Christmas 
decorations for the city.

The Eldorado Jaycees are again 
sponsoring their Annual I.R.A. (In­
ternational Rodeo Association) 
Rodeo Friday and Saturday, August 
14 and 15. Weekend events begin 
Friday afternoon, August 14, with 
the traditional Rodeo Parade through 
downtown Eldorado. Participants 
are welcome to join the parade by 
meeting in front of the Memorial 
Building. The parade is scheduled to 
begin at 4 p.m. Friday. For further 
information, call Johnny Mayo Jr. at 
853-2420 after 7 p.m.

The rodeo performances will begin 
at 8 p.m. each night. Events include 
saddle bronc riding, bareback bronc 
riding, calf roping, team roping, 
girl’s barrel racing, and wild bull 
riding. The Devil’s River Rodeo 
Company of Sonora, Texas, is stock

Co-op B arbecue 

Set For Tuesday

producer for this year’s IRA Rodeo.
Rodeo books open Wednesday. 

August 12, at 8 a.m. at Whitten 
Liquid Feed. Entrants may call 
853-2944. Books close at 6 p.m. 
Wednesday.

Prizes for this year’s rodeo include 
a $200 per event added prize money 
as well as trophy buckles for winners 
in each event. Buckles have been 
donated by Top Package Store, First 
National Bank of Eldorado, Johnny 
Mayo - Hodges & Fields Cotton 
Buyer, Henderson Water Well Ser­
vice, Whitten Liquid Feed Company, 
Poynor Construction Company, Ash­
ley’s Western Wear, and the Eldo­
rado Jaycees.

The Jaycees are sponsoring a 
dance both nights following the 
rodeo performances with music fur­
nished by the Sidewinders, a local 
group. Dancers are encouraged to 
bring their lawnchairs and tables to 
the slab for the outdoor dance both 
Friday and Saturday evenings. Chris 
McCravey is in charge of arrange­
ments.

The Jaycees are currently selling 
raffle tickets for 100 gallons of 
gasoline to be raffled off each night. 
Chairman for the raffle is Richard 
Preston. Raffle tickets may be 
purchased from any Jaycee member.

The Rodeo Queen contest is taking 
entrants. To date only one contes­
tant has been received. Ray Lewis 
Ballew is chairman of the Queen’s 
Contest and may be contacted at 
either 853-2617 or 853-2153. This 
year’s Queen will receive a trophy 
belt buckle worth approximately 
$200.00. Runners-up will receive 
gift certificates.

The Overall Cookers will be 
providing a barbecue concession 
stand at the rodeo in addition to the 
Jaycees’ concession stand. Wayne 
McGinnes is chairman of the Jay­
cees’ concession.

Other chairmen for the weekend’  ̂
activities include Steve Whitten 
Rodeo Chairman. Johnny Mayo, Jr. 
Arena Director, and Ross Whitten 
and Sam Henderson - Rodeo Com 
mittee Members.

Godwin Funeral Is Today
A long-time Eldorado resident and 

Schleicher County agriculture 
Agent, William Grady “ Tiny” God­
win died Monday in Ruidosa, N.M. 
after suffering a heart attack.

Services have been set for 10 a.m. 
today (Thursday) at First Baptist 
Church. Burial will be in Eldorado 
Cemetery under direction of Kerbow 
Funeral Home.

Mr. Godwin was born Feb. 6, 1911 
at Chappell in San Saba County. He 
married Martha E. Cowart in Wich­

ita Falls June 24, 1935. He moved to 
Eldorado from Coleman Feb. 15, 
1937.

He served with the fifth corps and 
combat engineers in the armed 
forces during World War II in the 
European Threatre, and then Africa, 
Sicily, Italy, and France for two 
years.

He attended schools in Lometa 
and received his bachelor and mas­
ters degrees from Texas A&M 
University.

A member of the Masonic Lodge 
and Order of the Eastern Star, he 
was also a member of the First 
United Methodist Church.

He was preceded in death by three 
sisters and three brothers and sur­
vived by his wife of Eldorado and 
several nieces and nephews.

Pallbearers are Delbert Taylor 
Weatherly Kinser, Pete Peters,’ 
Jimmy West, John Pitts and Joe 
Christian.

Francisco Cruz Killed In Accident
An Eldorado man, Francisco 

Javier Cruz, 34, was killed in an oil 
well accident Thursday while work­
ing on aft oil drilling rig about 12 
miles northeast of Mertzon.

Mr. Cruz, a roughneck for Wes- 
Tex Drilling Co., was shocked when 
he came in contact with bare wires 
on the rig. He was taken to Shannon 
West Texas Memorial Hospital 
where he died.

Services were held at Our Lady of

Guadalupe Catholic Church Sunday 
with Rev. Mark Woodruff, pastor, 
officiating. Burial was in Eldorado 
Cemetery.

He was born April 25, 1947 in 
Jose De Aura, Mexico to Berna 
and Gertrudis Flores Cruz. He 
married Maria Falcon in San Jose 
and moved to Eldorado from Grand 
Prarie in 1976.

He is survived by his wife, Maria 
Cruz of Eldorado; two daughters,

Aracelie Cruz and Marie Cruz; two 
sons, Francisco Javier Cruz, Jr. and 
Rojelio Cruz, all of Eldorado; his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bernando 
Cruz of San Jose, Mexico; three 
brothers, Silberio Cruz of Grand 
Prarie, Ben Cruz of Eldorado and 
Marko Antonio Cruz of San Jose, 
Mexico; two sisters, Iordis Garcia of 
Grand Prarie and Sylvia Garcia of 
San Jose. Mex.

About 800 persons are expected to 
attend the annual meeting of South­
west Texas Electric Cooperative, Inc. 
at 7 p.m. Tuesday on the court­
house square.

This will be the 36th annual 
membership meeting of the Eldo­
rado based cooperative.

Members will be treated to a bar­
becue supper provided by Dee Tyler 
and the Branding Iron Smokehouse 
in Sonora followed by a general 
membership meeting. Later, a 
drawing for door prized will follow 
and service pins will be awarded.

Elton McGinnes, general mana­
ger, will address the group during 
the business meeting cooperative 
connected 495 new meters and 
added 150 miles of line to the system 
in 1980 and contracted a new power 
supply contract with West Texas 
Utilities Company.

The cooperative was established in 
1945 and serves the rural area in all 
of Schleicher County and portions of 
Tom Green, Menard, Concho, 
Sutton, Val Verde, Crockett, Pecos, 
Upton, Reagan and Irion Counties.

The cooperative board is made up 
of J.D . Strauss, president; Fred 
Case, vice president; Peyton Cain, 
secretary; W.W. Owens, treasurer 
and directors, Jerry Johnson, Steve 
Williams, and William L. Brown.

There are 31 employees, 24 of 
which work in Eldorado, five who 
work in Ozona and two in Big Lake.
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C.H. Poynor Construction
605 So. Main 853-3064

PONT MISS OUT ON THE FUN!
SCHLEICHER

Eldorado Instrument & Control 
Hwy277 853-2506

Jackson's Joint Inspection
107 W Brooks 853-2991

Ozona Butane
Hwy. 163 392-3013

Eldorado Woolen Feed Store
SouAMain 853-2820

Memo's Grocery Store
Corner o f San Saba and San Antonio

Big John's Welding
Menard Highway

Kent's Automotive
Huy. 277____________853-2733

Schleicher Counly leader

Downtown

853-2032

Kerbow Furniture
Downtown Sonora 387-5500

Parker Foods
Downtown 853-2787

Foxworlh-GalbraHh lumber Co.
Downtown 853-2744

Cathy's
Hwy. 277 853-2645

Trey Trucking
San Angelo Hwy. 853-2186

The Western Company

Hwy. 277 

853-2553

Duncan Texaco Station
Hwy. 277 853-2993

Sutton Specially
300 Brooks A m . 853-2574

COUNTY

Saturday. August 8 
SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
10 a.m.--Arts and Crafts Fair booths open
10 a.m.-Talent Shout for ages six through 12
11 a.m.-Ladies and mens washer toss and horseshoe 

pitch begins Entry fee-H
12 noon-Jalapena pepper eating contest Entry fee—M 

1 p.m.-Tobacco spitting contest Entry fee-*1
Talent show for adults and senior citizens 

1:30 p.m.-Cow chip throwing contest Entry fee~*1 
2:30 p.m.-Toe sack races No entry fee

3 p.m. -Tricycle race for three, four and five year olds 
No entry fee, no need for pre-registration

3:30 p.m.-Ugly face contest No entry fee, no 
pre-registration

4 p.m.-Bubble gum blowing contest 
4:30 p.m.-Tug of War SO cents each or *2 per team

Register by 1p.m.

requiring registration, 
the Memorial Building.

J p

Arts & Crafls Fair 
Talent Show

Drawing for Groceries 
Games For Everyone

CasaArispe
Sooth Main 

853-2143

Sonora Ford Sales
115 NW Concho Sonora 387-3910

Pat Walker's
Hwy. 277 Sonora 387-3874

Peggy's Dress Shop
Hwy. 277 853-3085

R&H Well Service
in Angelo Hwy. 853-2003

Downtown Sonora 387-2507

First National Bank
Downtown 853-2535

Southwest Texas Electric Co-Op
4L  Cm I C !21 East Gtltis Are. 853-2544

Dee's Floral Design
Vt mile out of on Hw». 190 853-2152

Spain's
Downtown Sonora 387-3131

Quadra
Hwy277 853-3004

Television Enterprises
206 E. Main Sonora 387-3344

Gibson's
Hwo 277 Sonora 387-3523

Western Auto
Hwy. 277 B53-M51

L.R. Harnisch 
Water Well Drilling

Orient His. 
853-2686

Hext Grocery
ISWGiRis 853-2892

Shaw's Motel
Hwy 277 853-2866
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From The County Agent

In a wet crop year such as 
1981 has been up to now, 
cotton often makes a lot of 
vegetative growth and not 

-  much else. But use of a 
growth regulator can pro­
vide some relief of that 
problem.

“ Pix, a growth regulator 
developed several years 
ago, holds a lot of promise 
for cotton, particularly in a 
wet year,” points out Dr.
Bob Metzer, cotton special­
ist with the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service,
Texas A&M University Sys­
tem.

“ When applied as the 
first few white blooms 
appear, Pix reduces plant

Wanted in Menard Texas

Searching for a certified lab technichin 
or a certified radiology technichin with 
willingness to train and other 

Full or part time. Excellent benefits.
Salary nogoticible 

Call for appointment and for more 
information.

Contact
Micheál Puntney 
Administrator of 
Menard Hospital

915-396-4515

height, increases lateral 
branching, and makes for a 
more uniform cotton crop,” 
explains the specialist.

This growth regulator 
has been used in studies 
involving both picker and 
stripper variety cottons 
throughout Texas, notes 
Metzer. Lint yields were 
equal or higher than un­
treated plots when ade­
quate moisture was avail­
able during the early bloom 
period. However, Metzer 
cautions that using the 
product when cotton is 
under moisture stress can 
reduce yields.

In addition to having the 
potential for improving 
yields, Pix creates a more

uniform crop that enables 
more effective defoliation 
as farmers get ready to 
harvest. Furthermore, har­
vesting efficiency is in­
creased due to the crop’s 
uniformity, says the spe­
cialist.

‘‘Field demonstrations 
and studies this year with 
Pix should provide a wealth 
of information because of 
the kind of weather condi­
tions we’ve had,” notes 
Metzer. “ We will be able 
to get some good compari­
sons between treated and 
non-treated fields, and this 
information will help us 
develop better guidelines 
for using the product in the 
future.”

B a p tis t C hurch 

Sets B ib le  School 

Next W eek
The First Baptist Church 

will be having its Vacation 
Bible School next week, 
from Monday through Fri­
day. It will be for four year 
olds through students in 
the sixth grade and will be 
from 8:30 a.m. to 11 a.m. 
Commencement exercises 
will be at 7 p.m. Sunday.

Department heads will 
be Pam Williford, four year 
olds; Margaret Turner, five 
year olds; Mrs. Jim Robin­
son, first and second 
graders; Becky Harris, 
third and fourth graders 
and Arlene Payne, fifth and 
sixth graders.

For further information, 
contact the church office.

Schleicher County Leader Thursday, August 6, 1981 Page 3

In These Days

LITTLE BOY, BIG CERTIFICATE-Stoney Harris, three year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Harris, shows his mother the certificate he received through the 
summer reading program sponsored by the county library this summer. About 20 
local youngsters received the certificates for completing the program which 
followed the theme of Monsters this year. Gladys Gunn, librarian, was in charge of 
the program.

FIVE YEARS AGO-Ser- 
vices were pending for 
Sandy Donaldson, 59.

Bob Rutledge, a former 
resident of Eldorado, was 
killed during an oilfield 
accident southwest of 
Sonora. Another victim 
was Wayne Luxton of 
Sonora.

Virginia Sue Hardgrave 
and Hyman Dale Sauer 
were engaged.

The class of 1966 was 
having their tenth year 
reunion.

Jud Jones, operator of 
the local telephone system 
in the early part of the 
century, died in Cisco.

12 YEARS AGO-The El­
dorado Volunteer Fire De­
partment was celebrating 
its 30th year anniversary.

Value of production from 
oil wells in the county was 
estimated at $7.3 million 
and from natural gas wells 
at $3.1 million.

Jess Ashmore, veteran 
barber here, died at the age 
of 80.

Susan Jean Hill was 
awarded a scholarship from 
Texas Christian University.

About 1200 invitations 
were sent out to members 
of Southwest Texas Elec-; 
trie Cooperative for their 
annual meeting.

35 YEARS AGO -M r; 
and Mrs. W.O. Alexander 
were notified that their son, 
W.O. Alexander, Jr ., was 
being transferred to Geor­
gia for further treatment for 
polio.

Eldorado was awarded a 
fire truck from the Army 
Surplus post.

Shell employees and 
their families enjoyed a 
barbecue, swimming and 
boating and other attrac­
tions at Christoval during 
their annual outing.

Work was being done on 
the telephone dial building

Luke “ Bubba” Thomp­
son was discharged from 
the Navy.

Ray Boyer opened a rddib 
and appliance shop.

Bebee, F in ley W in F irs t

Helen Bebee and Pete 8an and Ina Lambert. ;•*
Finley were first place win- Lying for fourth and fifth
ners in last week’s Du- were Mary Lois Brown of 
plicate Bridge play. Nancy ™n Angelo and Ann Parker 
Law of Sonora and Jack °* Ozona with Lottie Puck- 
Bebee won second and and Fred Adkins of
third went to Lunetta Mor- Sonora.

Class o f ’66 Reunion Set
The -Eldorado High rodeo and dance sponsored 

School class of 1966 will be by the Jaycees. 
having its 15th year reunion Hosts are Wayne and
at 5 p.m. Aug. 15 at the Cindy McGinnes, Janee 
Park- ' - and Tip Finley, Joe Max

Class members will bring and Marty Edmiston, Bob 
a sack lunch for their and Nancy Lester and 
families and then attend a Karen and Sam Henderson.

DON’T LET ’EM GET A W A Y !

harp AM-FM- 
Cassette Player- 

Recorder 
S a le -$250 .

Je r ry ’s TV

* S T T

ohnnie Harris’ 
Beauty Shop
Hair Frost 

2S00
Open Mon.-Sat 8-6 

500 Fields 853-2983

Buy 7 and get 8 
f l  free!)SPARK PLUGS 
K ent’s 

A utom otive
853-2733  Eldorado

>%Off 
Selected items

P at’s
Sew ’n Sew
853-2837 Main St.

Get $ 2  OFF ON
$10 purchase 
McC ALLA’S

D ow ntow n Eldorado

We siend m illions of dollars to  educate and tra in  ou r  
com  in an ity ’s young people...the fin est “cro p ” of all 
w e produce. Then w e a w a tch  th em  steal aw ay to
o th e r cit*es, o th e r states, w h ere  th ey  believe o p p o rtu n ities  
aregreater. W hy ca n ’t  W E, r ig h t h ere in Eldorado, offer  
them  th e  career fu tu res th ey  seek in d istan t places?
Why n ot t r y *0 Keep ou r hom e-raised kids a t hom e?
Our stores, am  service firm s could offer lo ts m ore Job 
op p ortu n ities t th ey  did m ore business. T hey’d have m ore  
business if w e wc^id q u it buying item s and services ou t of 
tow n  Shoppug a t hom e in Eldorado is th e  best
insurance w e have ^ Keep ou r local ta le n t a t hom e and to  
m ake ou r co m m u n iv  stro n g  and grow ing.

LET’S PROVIDE BRIGHTER AND BETTER FUTURES FOR  
OUR PRECIOUS YOUNGoeoPLE.

L im it 1 c o ^ on per cu stom er

3 | | f Iwiches 
Reg. 1.99  

R.C. and Flavors  
Reg. 1.3910% Off 

BAUTISTA’S
GROCERY No.

A d vertise Here F o r  
'illy 7*# a W eek -A  real 
' eal D raw ing Card  

-or Y o u r Buisness
^hleicherCo.

Leader

B Q E C Z E
Dee’s

Floral Design
15% OFF

*/i m ile on Hwy 190. 
853-2152

Scissors
Reg S2 *’

Now $ 2 00
Schleicher 

County Leader

-i »

l a W iTILLERS 
CONDITIONERS

W estern A u t
853-2251 Hwy 2 7 7  |
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OES Honors 
Masons Monday

Jackson Twins Born July 26

A large group of persons 
attended.the Order of the 
Eastern Star no host pot 
luck supper honoring mem­
bers of the Masons Monday 
night. Held at the Eldo­
rado Masonic Lodge, the 
crowd enjoyed a delicious 
meal and then listened to 
toe-tapping music provided 
by Hayden Ellis and Fay 
Adams of San Angelo.

Members of OES and 
Masons presented a pro­
gram about the Eldorado 
group.

Worthy matron Mary 
Sofge introduced distin­
guished members, Nancy 
Bailey Allen past grand 
matron of the grand chap­
ter of Texas OES and

Gerald C. Allen, past grand 
patron of the Grand Chap­
ter of Texas OES, both of 
Robert Lee.

Jewell Van Dusen gave 
the Circle of Love and 
Buster Lamb, worshipful 
master of Eldorado intro­
duced Masonic lodge 
members.

Elton McGinnes intro­
duced Eldorado’s OES 
Masonic brothers and Mary 
Sofge introduced Eldo­
rado’s Eastern Star Mem­
bers. Bridgett Robinson 
represented the Rainbow 
for Girls.

A program was given on 
Rob Morris, founder of the 
Eastern Star.

Medicare Covers 
Nursing Care
Medicare Hospital Insur­

ance can cover care in a 
skilled nursing facility for 
people in the San Angelo 
area when eligibility condi­
tions are met, Frank Upp, 
social security District 
Manager in San Angelc 
said recently.

Hospital insurance 
covers post-hospital care in 
a skilled nursing facility 
that takes part in Medicare 
when all of the following 
conditions are met:

-The patient was in a 
hospital for at least 3 days

Flannagan Baby

Born Ju ly  21 in  

San Angelo

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Flannagan of Ozona an­
nounce the birth of a 
daughter, Lindsy Ellen, at 
Angelo Community Hospi­
tal. She was born on July 
21 and weighed 7 lbs., 4 oz.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Maness of Eldorado and 
Mr. and Mrs. Granville 
Flannagan of Ozona are the 
grandparents.

Mrs. Newman Billings of 
Del Rio and Mrs. A.W. 
Maness of Ozona are great­
grandmothers.

in a row, not counting day 
of discharge.

--The Patient is transfer­
red to the skilled nursing 
facility because he or she 
needs further care for a 
condition which was treated 
in the hospital.

-The patient is admitted 
to the facility within a short 
time, usually 14 days after 
leaving the hospital.

-A  doctor certifies that 
skilled nursing or skilled 
rehabilitation services are 
needed and being received 
on a daily basis.

--The facility’s utilization 
review committee or the 
professional standards re­
view organizations does not 
disapprove the stay.

When all of these condi­
tions are met, hospital in­
surance can pay for care for 
up to a maximum of 100 
days in each benefit period, 
but only if the care is 
needed for that length of 
time. Hospital insurance 
pays all of the costs of 
covered services for the 
first 20 days and all but 
$25.50 for up to 80 more 
days. For more information 
about the eligibility condi­
tions and the services medi­
care can cover, contact the 
San Angelo Social Security 
Office. The people there 
will be glad to answer any 
questions. The office is 
located at 2214 Sherwood 
Way, and the telephone 
number is 949-3718.

The Very Best 

Entertainment 

Direct to your home !
Channel 2 WFAA-Dallas ABC
Channel 3 Cable News . iw ^ 'k  
Channel 4 NOAA (Area Wean er) 
Channel 5 Home Box Ottic*-.
Channel 8 KCTV-San Anqelo CBS 
Channel 9 KACB-San Angelo NBC 
Channel 11 WTBS-Atlanta IND 
ChanneM 2 KVRN-Sonora Radi
Channel 13 KERA-Dallas Ed

News as it happens 

24 Hours a day
w  # 0
V  - 'W

Schleicher County

eader
Published Weekly on Thursdays 

Second Class Postage Paid at Eldorado, Texas 
Phone 853-2032 P.O. Box 782, Eldorado Texas 

Any erroneous reflection upon the character or stand 
lng of any person or film appearing in this pubiicatioi 
will be gladly and promptly corrected upon the calllnj 
the attention of the management to the article li

question. | |e|| £ (jm jst 0n ,IIE d itor
Teresa Stephens ...Advertising end 0 f^  

Manager
Tng

inch. Classified rate is 10 cents pei
Display advertising dpfcrf rfte

$2.00 minimum charge. Classified d tMHfcyi»$2.06 pei 
column Inch.

Notices of entertainnfent« w^eie adtn» Is
charged* notices of events or a ffcnll-raislng mature, 
cards of thanks, resolutions of respect, submitted 
poetry, and all such matters NOT NEWS will be for at 
the normal advertising earned ra te s .. Volume and 
frequency rates are available upon wrfctep request to 
the publisher or advertising sales majtogsUk

Yearly subscription rate is $7.50 in .county and $8.50 
outside Schleicher County.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Jack- 
son became surprised 
parents of twins July 26 in 
Wichita Falls. The early 
arrivals were born six 
weeks early and both meas­
ured 17 inches long.

They were named James 
Lucas, who weighed three 
pounds and 12 ounces and

Melissa Gayle who weighed 
three pounds and five and a 
half ounces.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Delmar Jackson 
of Eldorado and Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Hawley of Wich­
ita Falls. Great-grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs.

E.F. Hawley of Austin, Mr. 
and Mrs. J.W . Shelton of 
Baird and Mrs. Pearl Sim­
mons of Baird.

Mrs. Jackson has been 
released from the hospital, 
but the twins are expected 
to remain in the hospital for 
two more weeks.

OES O ffic e rs - C harlie  N ib le tt, M ary S ofge, B uste r Lam b

CHURCH DIRECTORY

Acts 8-30 “ And Philip ran right up to Him, and heard 
him read the prophet Esasias and said ‘Understandest 
thou what thou readest?’’’

Verse 31. “ And he said, ‘How can I except some 
man should guide me?’ and he desired Philip that he 
would come up and sit with him.’’

This man of Ethiopia was a man of great authority 
and trust. He came by reading that he didn’t 
understand and the only way he could understand was 
for someone to tell him that had a revelation on these 
writings.

The Lord put Philip in the right place to do his work 
or will. God knows who wants to come to the fullness of 
the truth and who wants to be content in thinking 
maybe it is this way or that.

Tradition has hindered peoples’ lives for soul 
salvation. See Him with all your heart so you can be 
saved.

Read the book of Acts and see what the Lord will 
open to your understanding. Jesus’ name, Baptism 
and receiving the Holy Ghost.

Rev. Walter Ford

FIRST
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Oak and Gillis 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11a.m . 
Adult Evening Bible Study 
Worship 7:00 p.m.
Wed. Prayer Service 7:30

ST. MARY’S 
EPISCOPAL CHURCH 
Rev. Lea Roy Aldwell 

Pelt St.&McWhorter Ave.
387-2617 (Sonora, Tex.) 

Sunday Morning Worship 
and Holy Communion

FIRST
PRESBYTERIAN

CHURCH
Rev. Ronald J . Sû to 

7 N.Cottonwood 
Sunday School IP am 
Morning WorsHP 10 am 

Fellowship Tim/10:30 a.m. 
Visitors Welcohe

CHURC* 0 F  JESUS 
CHRIST fF LATTER DAT 

SAINTS
Bishop Bryan Galloway 
San A*8el° 658-4797 
28l 7Fhristoval Rd.
p*esthood, 9 a.m. 
jrimary, 9 a.m.

Xelief Society, 9 a.m. 
Sunday School 10 a.m. 
Sacrament meeting 11 a.m.

OUI LADY 
OF GXJDALUPE 

C1URCH
Rev. Mali J . Woodruff 
Pastor 83-2663 
Saturday 7:00p.m.
Sunday 8:00a.m.[Spanish 

9:30a.m. |English)

WESTSIDE 
CHUJCH OF CHRIST 

HWY. 277
Sun.dorn.Serv. 10:30a.m. 
SunEve.Serv. 6:00p.m. 
Wo* Eve. Serv. 7:30p.m.

jrimitive Baptist Church 
Menard Hwy

Jider Freddy Boen, Pastor 
Services each 2nd & 4th 

iunday at 10:30a.m. and 
2:30p.m.

Also on Saturday night 
Before 2 and 4th Sun. 
Meeting at 7:00p.m.

PRIMERA IGLESIA 
BAUTISTA

Rev. E.L. Flores, Pastor 
ElPaso and Concho St. 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m 
Mom. Worship 11:00 a.m
6- 7 p.m. Training Union
7- 8 p.m. Evening Worship 
Wed. 3 p.m. Sunbeams
7 p.m. Prayer Services

FIRST
CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
Dale Lipsett, Minister 

Sunday School 10*15 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
Wed. Bible Study7:00 p.m. 

853-2247

UNITED
PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 

Rev. Walter Ford 
Hackberry St.

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship Service 11:00 a.m. 
Sun.Eve.Serv. 7:00 p.m.
Wed.Eve.Serv. 7:30 p.m. I

ROCK CHURCH
OF CHRIST

* Dale Huff, Evangelist 
708 Lee St-

Sunday Bible Class 10 a.m. 
Worship Service 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6 p.m. 
W'ed.BibleClass 7:30 p.m.

FIRS1" UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH

Rev. John A. Robinson 
Hlway 277 across from 

Courthouse
853-2721 853-3010
Church School 9:50 a.m. 
Mom. Worship 10:50 a,m.
Youth Fellowship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday:
Young Adult Study 7:30 
All are welcome.

This weekly church fea ture  is spouse ed by the fo llow ing m erchants who urge you
to  attend the church o f your choice th is  Sunday.

WESTERMAN DRUG

Cecil W esterman Would Like 
To Be Your Pharmacist

853-2226___

EL DORADO RESTAURANT
Steaks-Seafood & Mexican Foods 

Catering Service Available 
853-2818

pUTHWEST TEXAS 
lECTRIC CO-OP, INC. 

pined by Those We Serve

E ldor^0’ Texa* 853-2544

TREY TRUCKING

All Kinds Of O ilfield Trucking 

PEIdorado, Texas 853-2186

H olley House
“ For the Unique and Creative”  

Eldorado, Texas 853-2763

SONIC DRIVE-INN OF SONORA 
Hwy. 277 North

Sonora, Texas 387-52921

BUTLER SUPPLY COMPANY 
Oilmans Friend

East St.
Day 853-2503

Eldorado, Tias  
Night 85 '*0 M

FOOD CENTER
Herbert A Lois Fields, 0 \ r rs 

Les Robertsor Manag'
Sonora, Texas 387-3431

COMMERCIAL RESTAURANT 
Where Friends Meet To Eat 

Glasscock & Plum
Sonora, Texas 387-J928

R & H WELL SERVICE, INC. 
Complete O ilfie ld S ttry ic *

JEldorado, Texas 853-2003

THE WESTERN COMPANY 
Pacesetters in the Oil & Gas Industry!

Eldorado, Texas

S ch le ich e r County Leader
Interested persons may submit origin?1 

church features anytime. 858*2032
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School Pre-Registration Dates Set
Pre-registration dates for 

students in the Eldorado 
school system have been 
announced by high school 
principal Richard McCar- 
son and elementary prin­
cipal Richard Richey.

For the first time, elem­
entary students will have to

pre-register. Parents of 
children in grades one 
through six who attended 
the Eldorado school system 
last year can pre-register 
their child by calling 853- 
2770. They should call 
Thursday and F.riday, Aug. 
13 and 14 and ^Vednesday,

I

Thursday and Friday, Aug. 
19, 20, and 21.

New students in kinder­
garten through third grade 
need to enroll and bring 
their birth certificate, 
health record and immuni­
zation records. New stu­
dents in grades four

through six need to bring 
immunization records.

Registration for students 
in grades seven, eight and 
nine is set for Thursday, 
August 20 from 8 a.m. to 4 
p.m. Juniors and sopho­
mores will register Aug. 21 
in the morning and seniors

will register the same day 
in the afternoon.

New students should pre­
register at the high school 
between now and Aug. 24 
from 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m.

Band practice begins at 9 
a.m. Aug. 12 in the band 
hall.

:« V'; *-̂ "4'̂ '-:/
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Loeffler Announces Funds Approval

RODEO ACTION-These cowboys display some of the action that will be seen at 
the annual Jaycee rodeo next weekend. The rodeo weekend will begin with a 
parade at 4 p.m. Friday. Rodeo performances will be at 8 p.m. Friday and 
Saturday with dances following both performances.

Congressman Tom Loef­
fler today announced that 
the House Appropriations 
Committee approved more 
than $26.7 million military 
construction funds for Air 
Force and Army compo­
nents in San Angelo, San 
Antonio, and Del Rio, 
Texas.

The funds were part of an 
overall $6.9 billion military 
construction package

approved by the House 
committee for fiscal year 
1982.

Texas military facilities 
statewide received ap­
proval for more than $125 
million in construction- 
related funding in the 
committee action.

Loeffler was successful in 
having the committee 
accept his amendment to 
earmark $500,000 in funds 
to plan and design new 
cryptological and personal

facilities at Goodfellow Air 
Force Base in San Angelo.

The bases and projects 
receiving funding approval 
include $3.5 million for an 
unaccompanied enlisted 
personnel housing facility 
at Kelly Air Force Base; 
and $6.7 million for enlisted 
housing at Lackland AFB as 
well as $2.2 million for a 
marksmanship training 
building.

Brooks AFB won ao-

provai for $3.1 million for 
cooling/heating/ air-condi­
tioning projects while Ran­
dolph AFB received $2.3 
million for improvements at 
its Seguin, Texas, auxiliary 
field and $990,000 for data 
processing improvements.

Laughlin AFB in Del Rio 
received $1 million for a 
data processing facility, 
also.

In addition, the Commit­
tee approved $1.7 million

for a “ composite squad 
operations” for the Air 
National Guard at Kelly, 
$1.7 million for an aero- 
medical evacuation training 
facility for the Air Force 
Reserve at Kelly and $2.3 
million for a fuel systems 
maintenance dock.

The Army Reserve in San 
Antonio received $1.3 mil­
lion to upgrade its mainten­
ance shop operations.

Cotton Council Calls For 
Realistic Trade Policy

The National Cotton 
Council has called for a 
“ realistic” trade policy that 
provides for expanded 
international trade under 
conditions mutually accept­
able and beneficial to both 
exporting and importing 
countries.

In testimony filed here 
this week with Senate 
committees conducting 
joint oversight hearings on 
U.S. trade policy, the Coun 
cil cited the Multifiber 
Arrangement and its bi­
laterals as examples of 
realistic policy.

“ They provide for ex­
panded trade...yet at the 
same time, they give some 
order to internation textile 
and apparel trade so that it 
will not unduly damage the 
importing country’s textile 
and apparel industries,” 
the Council stated.

The industrywide cotton 
organization said this sys­
tem could possibly be used 
to resolve some of the 
nation’s other significant 
and delicate trade issues.

“ Free trade is a myth in 
today’s world,” the Council 
said. “ It is based on the 
premise that government 
regulations, monetary con­
ditions, labor, capital, 
transportation, etc., are 
relatively similar in all 
countries. This is not the 
case now, nor is it likely to 
be in the future.”

The Council said the U.S. 
shoudl work toward more 
liberalized international 
trade on a fair and recip­
rocal basis without under­
mining or weakening its 
own economy.

A ppropriate fed era l 
action, for example, should 
be taken to provide reason­
able restraints against for­
eign imports that are dis­
rupting or threatening to 
disrupt important sectors of 
the national economy. 
Import restraint is espe­
cially needed, the Council 
added, when the domestic 
industry is required by 
government to install ex­
pensive safety and health

equipment not required of 
its foreign competition.

Attention was also called 
to the proposal by the 
United Nations Conference 
on Trade and Development 
for an international cotton 
agreement which would 
include production con­
trols, export quotas, floor 
and ceiling prices, and an 
international buffer stock.

The Council warned that 
this would be contrary to 
trade liberalization, would 
undermine the market- 
oriented U.S. farm pro­
gram and would inevitably 
lead to limited U.S. raw 
cotton exports.

To increase the nation’s 
exports, the cotton organi­
zation called for efforts to: 
1. Reduce other countries’ 
non-tariff trade barriers, 2. 
expand and improve the 
DISC program, 3. provide 
non -su bsid ezed  export 
credit and 4. correct in­
equitable taxation of U.S. 
citizens stationed abroad by 
exporting organizations.

LOWER FINANCE

Come in now and save two wavs at

KEN BRADENM0T0RS
1-10 at Golf Course Road 307-2529

Tom Clifton says “ We're continuing our

Mrs. Andy Allen 
Named Chairman

,ne Star Chapter of 
c Fibrosis Founda- 
mnees the appoint­
ors. Andy Allen ae 
n of its 1981 Breath 
lampaign in Chris-

Zampaign will be 
provide the com- 
with information 

rstic Fibrosis and to 
nds to support re­
education and care

programs for CF patients.
The number one genetic 

killer of children, Cystic 
Fibrosis is inherited and 
incurable - claiming three 
lives each day. An esti­
mated one in 20 Americans 
is a symptomless carrier of 
the recessive CF gene. 
Currently, half of all child- 
en born with CF will die 
before reaching their 20th 
jirthday.

SIZZLIN’SUMMER SALE
One more week! Sale ends Aug 8,1981 We’ve proved our point! 

Sonora prices are lower than those you’ll find in San Angelo!

Fred L. Speck, Jr., 
M.D.

announces
The Opening 
Of His Office 

For The P ra ctice  Of
D erm atology |

40 1  Ju n c tio n  H w y. 
K errv ille , Tex

Telephone j 
(512)9 896-2810 !

Skin D isorders 
Skin C ancer

M onday-Saturday  
H ours by A p p o in tm en t j

1981 Pontiac '

GRANDLeMANS!

Automatic Shift 
Power Shifting 
Power Brakes 
AirConditioned 
AM/FM Radio 
Cruise Controj 
Resume Speed 
Tilt Steering Wheel

3

Ust $9961.04

Our Price

8933
Sag
p ° ntS

j e t t o n

Demo S-1235

1981 Oldsmobile
DELTA 88 ROYAL!

5.0 Litre V8 
Automatic Shift 
Power Steering 
Power Brakes 
Air Conditioned 
AM/FM Radio 
Cassette 
Cruise Control 

Demo

$

List $10,415."

Our Price

9245
No. 11190

DISCOUNTED NEARLY *1200.M!

Front End
Alignment

For better road $  
handling and safety 27“

American made cars only

Convenient Dank Financing or GMAC, if  you choose.
Seo Sam D illa rd  o r Herb done»

KEN RRADEN MOTORS
1-10 at Golf Course Road 387-2529
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Nocona and Justin Boot 
Companies Plan Merger

A long-time association 
will be strengthened and 
perpetuated in an historic 
occasion taking place this 
summer—the merger of 
Nocona Boot Company and 
of Justin Industries, Inc., 
maker of Justin boots.

The roots of the relation­
ship began over a century 
ago when H .J. Justin 
traveled to Texas from In­
diana, settled in Spanish 
Fort in 1879 and began 
making boots for cowboys 
riding the famed Chisholm 
Trail.

Eventually operations 
were moved to Nocona, 
approximately 100 miles 
northwest of Fort Worth, 
and bootmaking was firmly 
established as the family

business.
However, in 1925, the 

siblings of H .J. Justin part­
ed, with Miss Enid Justin 
opting to stay in her home­
town of Nocona and John 
Justin Sr. and his two 
brothers establishing new 
Justin Boot headquarters in 
Fort Worth.

Now under the guidance 
of John J . Justin Jr ., chair­
man and chief executive 
officer, Justin Boot Com­
pany has grown to become 
a leading maker of quality 
boots in the burgeoning 
western wear market.

And, as president and a 
founder of Nocona Boot 
Co., Miss Justin developed 
that firm into a prosperous 
bootmaking company.

holley
>f||j| house 

Bridal Critique
Jeannie Nicholson, bride-elect of Hank Hutcherson
Mr. LrMrs. Robby Joyce 
For the U nique  

and cre a tiv e

@§3-3763 Eldorado  
H wy 7,11

¿ r
Bob Sykes ir  Lisa Jo lly 

LanisM iheska i i l y n n a  Sauer

McCalla’s
Downtown Eldorado

has the wonderful selection? that 

Lisa Jolly and Bobby Sykes 

have made for their wedding

Come see them soon
Hours:
Mon-Fri.
10 a.m.-5 p.m. 
Sat.-by 
appointment 
only.
2140 Hunt Street 

>~i Sonora Texas 70950

“a little bit 
of every­
thing nice”

915-387-2/13

915-387-2142

gajuum m m i.'.iA iJ.iti.M .i.i.'.i.'.iA iA iJ.i.'l

Now, nearly 60 years 
later, the two companies 
have agreed to merge. 
Nocona Boot Company will 

remain as a separate entity 
within the Justin corporate 
family structure, maintain­
ing its own identity, brand 
name, style of boots and 
management. Miss Justin 
will continue as president.

“ We are extremely 
pleased to have this associ­
ation. Nocona will become 
one of most prized com­
panies,” said John Justin. 
“ Over the years, we have 
always been on friendly 
terms.”

“ I am thrilled with the 
merger,” added Miss Jus­
tin.

Jerry Brownlee, presi­
dent of Justin Industries, 
said boot production of the 
two firms combined should 
reach about 6,000 pairs of 
boots a day by year-end, 
with capacity increasing to 
about 8,000 pairs daily by 
the end of 1982.

Justin operated its main 
boot factory in Fort Worth 
with a newly opened factory 
in El Paso and one in 
Cassville, Mo. With the 
acquisition of Nocona, its 
boot factory total will 
increase to six. Nocona’s 
new Gainesville factory is 
scheduled to open this fall 
and its current factories are 
in Nocona and Vernon.

Justin Industries also is 
the largest manufacturer of 
clay brick in the United 
States, one of the leading 
producers of concrete pro­
ducts in the South and mid- 
South, and designes and 
installs the only permanent 
water cooling tower mar­
keted in the world today. 
Justin’s stock is traded 
over-the-counter in the 
NASDAQ system, under 
the symbol “ JSTN.”

Homefront
Frankie and Don Weath­

erly of Dallas were visiting 
her sister and husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. ‘Jack Bebee 
last weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack An­
drews and Leland took a 
two week trip to Florida 
recently. Travelling with 
them were Dawn Andrews 
and Lisa Phillips/2 The 
group stayed at Panama 
City Beach and did some 
snorkling.

Rex Tucker of Big Spring 
is staying with his grand­
parents, Mr, and Mrs. E.H. 
Topliffe.

Imogene Edmiston has 
returned from visiting her 
sister, Mrs. R.T. McDaniel 
and her family in Mona­
hans last week.

Comptroller Rep To Be 
Here August 21

“ WeTe trying to cut the 
red tape in this office, and 
we believe these face ses­
sions with taxpayers help 
do just th a t,” Bullock

added.
The San Angelo office, 

headed by Bill Teaver, 
serves San Angelo and 
surrounding counties.

WEDDING SET-M r. and Mrs. Billy Green of Sonora 
and Mr. and Mrs. Sam A. Whitten of Eldorado are 
happy to announce the engagement and approach­
ing marriage of their children, Angela Green and Sam 
Whitten Jr.

A Sept. 12 garden wedding has been set at the home 
of the bride-elect’s parents at 305 Hightower.

The bride-elect is a 1981 graduate of Sonora High 
School where she was a member of the choir, band, and 
tennis team.

Whitten is a graduate of Eidorado High School and 
TSTI in Waco and is now employed as a diesel 
mechanic at Halliburton.

Grandparents of Miss Green are Mr. and Mrs. C.A. 
Luckett and Mrs. J.L. (Ruby) Brotherton, all of Sonora.

Mrs. Lewis (Fenna) Whitten of Eldorado is the 
grandmother of the prospective bridegroom.

The couple will make their home in Eldorado 
following their marriage.

Farm Bureau Asks 
For More Control

The Texas Farm Bureau ment wjth your decision to 
has asked the federal gov- deny the request of Cali- 
ernment to strengthen the fornia Governor Jerry 
quarantine on fruits and Brown j r . to declare fruit 
vegetables from the Medi- fly.infested areas a federal

State Comptroller Tlob 
Bullock will have a repre­
sentative from his San An­
gelo office in Eldorado on 
August 21, 1981 to assist 
local taxpayers and answer 
questions about state taxes.

Bullock said Enforce 
ment Officer Esther Espar­
za will meet with local 
taxpayers in the memorial 
Building from 9 to 10:30 
a.m.

“ If Eldorado area mer­
chants, or anyone else for 
that matter, have any ques­
tions about state taxes or 
need help in preparing 
state tax forms, Ms. Espar­
za will be there to assist 
them.” Bullock said.

Í i
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terranean fruit fly-infested 
quarantine area of northern 
California.

“ The spray area should 
be expanded to include a 
one-and-a-half mile buffer 
zone around all areas in 
which medflies have been 
found,” TFB President 
Carrol Chaloupka said in a 
telegram to President Rea­
gan.

The Texas farm leader 
also told the President: 
"W e are in complete agree-

disaster area.
“ We believe that the 

California governor has
contributed to the spread of 
the fruit fly. We feel his 
actions have jeopardized an 
important part of the 
nation’s food supply. In 
our opinion, he and the 
mi s g u i d e d  s o - c a l l e d  
environmentalists of his 
state have permitted the 
spread of the infestation 
through their inaction.

I
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Expanded Service at 
Menard Medical Complex
Dr. Charles Barnes, M.D.

General surgery and medicine
Dr. Victor Gardner, M.D.

Orthopedic surgery and medicine 
augmented by Dr. William Wallace, D.O.

Dr. Barnes, M.D. --
by appointment 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 

Monday, Tuesday, Wednesday and Friday 
8 a.m. to 12 noon Thursday

Dr. Gardner, M.D. -
by appointment 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 

Monday, Tuesday Thursday and Friday 
8 a.m. to 12 noon Wednesday and Saturday

A physician will be present at the clinic Monday through 
Friday during the noon hours.

Dr. William Wallace, D.O.
two weekends each month and clinic opened 
Saturday 8-12 noon

I
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W ith Fish Fry ¡  NOW O p ß fl
The Eldorado High 

School football team will be 
honored by the EHS cheer­
leaders with a fish fry 
before the scrimmage 
against Robert Lee Aug. 
28. Catered by Southern 
Seas in San Angelo, the 
meal will be served in the 
school cafeteria. Tickets 
are $4.35 for adults and 
$3.35 for children under 
ten.

Deadline for buying 
tickets is Aug. 25.
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Now Open

The Cottage
C orner o f W est & D ivide

Eldorado
10 a.m . S aturday

Junior & Misses Apparel

*
7 ^

£
tf

Jeans

accessories

dresses

jackets

shirts

sweaters

Owners M ary Legge tt ft Kathy F rench

Open 10 am to 5 pm Weekdays 10-4 Saturday
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Grand Jury 
Considers Cases

The Schleicher County 
Grand Jury met last Friday 
and considered three cases. 
An indictment was passed 
against Aurelio Levario 
Pando for subsequent 
offense for driving while 
intoxicated. He is out on 
$2,000 bond.

Lupe Rodriguez waived 
indictment for theft of a 
pickup.

The grand jury no billed 
Narciso Ortega and Rafael 
Tanguma for a shooting 
and stabbing incident last 
month.

Monthly Square |  

Dance Set I

Fashion
Beene Bag Andrew Geller

Jaque Cohen Candies

Bare Traps
HandBags and Shoes Evan Bicone

Hose &*Socks

Etienne Aigner
Hand Bags and Shoes

The Kountry Kousins 
Square Dance Club will be 
having its monthly square 
dance at 8 p.m. Friday 
night in the Memorial 
Building. Several dancers 
are expected to participate 
from surrounding towns 
such as Brady, San Angelo, 
and Sonora.

Tom Payne of Del Rio 
will be the caller.

, S t y  l i n g

Rene's
Beauty Shop’

853-2747

Open 10 AM to 5 
Monday thru Saturday

Layaways Welcome!

B t B
Shoe 
Barn
Hwy 2 7 7N

Sonora, 
Texas
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DISCÒunTcìNTEK
Prices good Thurs., Fri-, Sat.

Lose weight sensibly in

14 DAYS

DietGarcT
14  D A Y ©  

D I E T  P L A N
4¿> L-rtü5ul0S

42 Capsules A g g  
or tablets £

WOOD FRAME
DIRECTOR 
CHAIR

Reg 2691

V.
*EXTRA STRENGTH

3-PC Cast Iron 

S k ille t Set

Gandy’s A ll F lavors

Ice Cream
Vi G allon round

65

“TV

s e e s

DAD'S 
ROOT BEER

R egu la r & Sugar Free

6-p°k 4  3 g
12-oi. Cans I  ****

T U B U L A R
H A N G E R S

Lingerie
Hooks

Lightweight
Colorful

Keys Made
Buy One Key a t re g u la r 
p r ic e -G e t a 4  g  
second Key fo r

I Q foi l 00
20" BOX FANS

2-Speed

20"
3-Speed

C olgate" |
. in :  M fP  UOftIDl TOOTH PASH •  ■  lu

a: 
o
2

to o th p a s te  

5 oz tube  A A C

2-DRAW ER 
FILE CABINET

Double Drawer Lock 

D ivider block in each drawer

2 9 97

Apple Juice
64 oz

75

S A V E  M O R E  S A V E

Santa Cruz S tyle
Towels

Bath Hand
39  0 1 9

W ash C loths

I 77
D ecora tive

Pub M irrors
io y 2 ” x i3 V 2 ”
you r ch o ice

3"
Contact Shelf Paper

3 yds. x 18”
1 1 9

S  3 U 0 IA I  3 A V S  3 U 0 IA I

WE WILL MAIL YOU A PASS 
FOR ONE FREE NIGHTS 

LODGING ATA PARTICIPATING
Harriott Hotel:

You pay full price for Friday or Saturday night’s 
lodging at a participating Marriott Hotel, we pay for 

the next night’s lodging in the same room, with 
purchase of only three of the participating brands.

n

ban
ROLL-ON

DEODORANT

REGULAR.
UNSCENTED.

FRESH

2.5 oz

LIQUID 
HAIR GROOM

7 o z

duraceli:
Alkaline Batteries

/ O u b l ie r

¿ '-'I r , , ,

full 60 capsules or 
, 100 tablets

Excefrin

-•■’j

REGULAR/ UNSCENTED

TICKLE

nasal spray

LONG ACTING

’/2 0Z

TICKLE*
ROLL-ON A N T I-PERSPIRANT 

D EO D O R A N T

Size C & D 
2-Pak

* ^ i 9 V b l t

m $ sCube

FLORAL
CITRUS
HERBAL
UNSCENTED

RUBIK'S CUBE'*
•  Over 3 Billion Combinations— 

Just One Solution)
•  Sensational Mindbender Puzzle.
•  Just a few simple turns are 

required to produce a 
completely random pattern.

•  Try to get Rubik's Cube back into 
its original 6-solid colored sides.

•  Ages 8 and up.
ARE YOU UP TO THE
CHALLENGE!

Girl Scout 
Leaders Needed

Adult volunteers are the key to good Girl Scouting. Many men and women have 
received a great deal of pleasure by sharing their interests and abilities thereby 
helping us to achieve our purpose, “ to inspire girls with the highest ideals of 
character, conduct, patriotism, and service so that they may become happy and 
resourceful citizens.”

There are many volunteer positions available for concerned, dedicated adults (18 
years and older). Some require several hours a week, working with girls or adults, 
some require several hours a week but on a short time basis, some require only a 
few hours a week on a continuing basis, and soihe for perhaps only one day or a few 
hours. Refer to the chart below to see where you fit into our family. If you can 
volunteer some of your time to Girl Scouts, please contact Becky Jones at 853-3120.

AMOUNT OF TIME AVAILABLE POSITIONS

SEVERAL HOURS A WEEK (with girls) Troop leader, assistant leader, co­
on a continuing basis leader

SEVERAL HOURS A WEEK (with adults) Neighborhood chairman, Service unit 
on a continuing basis coordinator, Troop Consultant, Neighborhood

service team

SEVERAL HOURS A WEEK (with girls) Troop Consultant (to teach something to 
only during one part of the year the troop, Troop Cookie Chairman, Troop Fin­

ance Chairman

SEVERAL HOURS A WEEK (with adults) Troop Organizer, Neighborhood Cookie 
only during one part of the year Chairman

OCCASIONALLY (with girls or adults) Neighborhood Program Specialist, Trans­
portation, Phone Calls, Publicity

I would like to help with a troop which meets weekly--------------- bi-
weekly------------------ on a weekday-------------------on a weeknight
monthly----------------------• , ,
1 am available to teach------------------------------- periodically, but 1 can t commit
myself to an ongoing committment.
I would love to be a leader for a troop of---------------------------- age-level (Brownie,
Junior, Cadette, Senior). . . .  f
I could be a coordinator of a program of different events requiring lots ot
consultants, because I know lots of people-------------------------Name
Address--------------------------------------Phone------------------------------------------------------

Search for 1982 
Maid Of Cotton Begun

The search for the 1982 
Maid of Cotton has official­
ly begun, the National 
Cotton Council announced 
today.

Winner of the 1982 selec­
tion, to be held here Dec. 
27-29, will start Jan. 1 as an 
ambassador for the Ameri­
can cotton industry.

Now in its 44th year, the 
selection is open to young 
women between 19 and 23 
who were born in a cotton- 
producing state or who

Season T icke t 

H olders Have

have maintained legal resi­
dence in the Cotton Belt 
since age seven or earlier. 
Applicants also must be at 
least five feet five inches 
tall, and never have been 
married.

The new Maid’s interna­
tional tour will include par­
ticipation in major public 
relations and cotton promo­
tion activities in Asia. 
Canada and Europe. Dom­
estic tour will include 
speaking before civic clubs 
in major metro-

politan cities, and visits to 
major cotton-producing 
states.

Following completion of 
her seven-month tour, the 
1982 Maid will receive a 
$2,000 educational grant 
from the Council.

Application forms for en­
tering the selection may be 
obtained from the Council, 
P.O. Box 12285, TN 38112. 
Deadline for submitting 
completed applications and 
required photographs is 
Nov. 7.

O ption

Anyone who had season 
tickets for hometown foot­
ball games should exercise 
their option for keeing their 
tickets by contacting high 
school principal Richard 
McCarson before Aug. 19.

The football team will 
have two scrimmages this 
month and will have the 
first game of the season 
against Rankin at 8 p.m. 
September 4.

Com plete R em odeling 
R epa iring  o r B u ild ing  

Free Estim ates 
R em odeling-P atios 

C oun te rtops-K itchens-B a ths 
Room A dd itions-S id ing  
P aneling-P atch Jobs 

Call M ike
Mike Case

853-2253 l
Box 97 E ldorado j

M M W W y V W

Shop
Western Atrio

in
Eldorado 

For Your Homo 
& Hardware Needs

Furniture 
Car Care Hems 

Toys 
Stereos

home Appliance 
lawn Mowers 
Air conditions 

lawn Care Homs
Step By and Visit Us!

WESTERN AUTO
Associate Store 

Buddy White, Owner 
853-2251
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CLASSIFIED ADS
Legai Notice Team  W ins G olf Tourney

Legal Notice

PUBLIC NOTICE 
The Schleicher County 
I.S.D. would like to extend 
you an invitation to bid on 
the gasoline supply for the 
1981-82 school year. We 
will have a 6000 gallon tank 
installed on school property 
and will use approximately 
25,000 gallons of regular 
trade.
Prices are to be quoted in 
cents per gallon on regular. 
In the event of a price 
increase from your sup­
pliers, a written notification 
will be required. Schleicher 
County I.S.D. is exempt 
from Federal Excise Tax, 
our Tax Exemption Number 
is A-313977. Prices are to 
reflect this discount.
All bids must be returned to 
the Superintendent’s off icy 
the Superintendent’s office 
by 4:00 p.m. August 10, 
1981. All bids must be 
addressed to Guy Whitaker, 
Superintendent of Schools, 
P.O. Box W, Eldorado, 
Texas 76936.
A bid on No-Lead will be 
received, however, we do 
not have a storage tank and 
your bid would be at your 
service station or key lock 
system.__________________

Legal Notice

NOTICE OF 
PUBLIC HEARING

Notice is hereby given that 
the Eldorado City Council 
will hold a public hearing on 
the proposed City Budget 
for Fiscal Year 1981-82 on 
Tuesday, August 11, 1981, 
at 7:30 p.m. at City Hall. 
The proposed City Budget 
for General Fund, Utility 
Fund, Trash Collection 
Fund and Revenue Sharing 
Funds is available for public 
inspection between 8:00 
a.m. and 5:00 p.m. Monday

through Friday at City Hall.
All interested citizens are 

invited to attend.
Carolyn Mayo 
City Secretary 

__________________ 7-31-81

Legal Notice

PUBLIC NOTICE 
MARKS AND BRANDS-—  
RECORDING AND RE-RE­
CORDING IN ALL COUN­
TIES

Section 1. (a) This Act 
shall apply to every county 
in this State. In all oounties 
each owner of any livestock 
mentioned in Chaper 1 of 
Title 121 of the Revised 
Civil Statutes of 1925 shall 
within six months after this 
Act takes effect have his 
mark and brand for such 
stock recorded in the office 
of the County Clerk of the 
County. These owners shall 
reoord the marks and brand- 
s whether the brands and 
marks have previously been 
reoorded.or not.

(c) After the expiration of 
six months from the taking 
effect of this Act all records 
of marks and brands now in 
existence in the County 
shall no longer have any 
force or effect and after the 
expiration of six months 
only the reoords made after 
this Act takes effect shall be 
examined or considered in 
recording marks and brands 
in the County.

Section 3. All brands and 
marks registered under the 
provisions of this Act shall 
be re-registered every 10 
years in the manner pre­
scribed in Section 1 of this 
Act.

This act was effective 
August 30, 1971.

IN ACCORDANCE WITH  
A T T O R N E Y  G E N E R A L  
OPINION #MW-289, which 
states: “ Article 6899j, V.T.- 
C.S., requires that all marks 
and brands registered prior 
to AUGUST 30, 1981, must

HP ** * * * *|
|  W e  v fH i b e  le a n in g  E l d o r a d o  in  a  f e w  d a y s . I n l l i e  f  
|  t t e i r t y o u  h a v e  f a i f e d  t o  g o t  y o u r  r e p a i r s  m a d e  b y  | 

N ils  t i m e , y o u  s h o u ld  g e t  th e m  t o  f h e  s h o p  
IM M E D IA T E L Y  i n  o r d e r  t o  a v o id  a n  u n n e c e s s a r y  | 

|| t r i p  o u t  o f  to w n  p i n s  d e l a y s  i n  h a v in g  r e p a i r s  
I  p i c k e d  u p  a  s e c o n d  t r i p  o u t  o f  to w n .

TkO U CobU tf

I  Mobile Boot and Shoe Repair Shop §
Hexfs Parking Lot

I  Hwy277 Eldorado J

BUILT-UP COMPOSITION

A-l ROOFING COMPANY
'•*» " *$  Repair Specialist

SERVICF -I- QUALITY =  SATISFACTION

| 896-2561
:jj: WOOD SHINGLÈ REPAIR ROOF TILE REPAIR
£  4 YEAR MAINTENANCE GUARANTEE

Christoval

JP
S
f f i
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E
E
E
i
i
i
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Isn’t it 
about time 
you ran a

GARAGE
SALE

A ll o f  th o se  u n w a n te d  
h o u seh o ld  articles, used  
clothing, o ld  baby fu rn i­
ture, used tires from your 
old car and old toyscanbe  
turned into usable CASH. It’s 
easy! Just gather them up, 
make a list, then phone in a 
classified ad and we’ll run it 
under our Garage Sale head­
ing. Then get ready for the 
buyers! Our classified ads 
bring results!

Schleicher Co.
& 1 &

be re-registered within six 
months of that date, and 
that the re-registration pro­
cess must be repeated at 
subsequent ten-year inter­
vals for then-current own­
ers.’ ’

T H E  S C H L E I C H E R  
COUNTY CLERKS OFFICE 
will oommence re-register­
ing brands on Monday, 
AUGUST 31, 1981, and all 
brands presently on record 
will be held for the reoord 
owner to re-register through 
February 28,1982, at which 
time the un-registered 
brands on reoord will be- 
oome open to the general 
public for registering.

Witness My Hand and 
Seal of Office this 1st day of 
August, 1981.

Helen Bebee 
County Clerk, 

Schleicher County 
Texas

fas for Sale

Linooln Towncar. Good 
mechanical condition. 
Needs some body work. 
$1400. Call 853-2541.

Business Opportunities

Work at home jobs avail­
able! Substantial earnings 
possible. Call 504-614-8003 
Extension 569. For Infor- 
mation.__________________

Business Service

Babysitting in my home. 
For more information please 
call Kathy Donaldson at 
853-2421.________________

^ C a r d o y h a n k ^ ^

We would like to thank the 
Eldorado Fire Department 
& Sheriff’s Dept, for their 
fast & efficient work in 
putting out our grass fire. 

Charles & Helen Pfluger

We would like to thank each 
and everyone of you for 
helping save our house and 
personal belongings as well 
as the ranch country. To the 
fire departments, the law 
enforcement agencies, the 
employees at the ARCO 
plant, as well as everyone 
else involved, we say 
Thanks.

George, Su, Randy 
and Kimberly Scott

For Safa
Yashica Super 8 movie cam­
era with electric zoom lens, 
automatic focus, fade in /out 
and slow motion. “ Conn” 
coronet with case. Both 
items in excellent condition. 
Please call 853-2421.

14X70 Mobile Home to be 
moved. 2 bedroom, 2 full 
bath, total electric, central 
heat, refrigerated air, large 
closets, 8X12 oovered por­
ch. Purchased new Nov. 
’79, excellent oondition. 
Will consider any reason­
able offer. Phone 853-2398.

House For Sale!
3 Bedroom with patio. 201 
E. Field Street. 853-3048.

Fishing Worms For Sale-- 
Elmer Garlitz 101 Bluebon­
net 853-2817.

For Sale-20 Cu. Ft. Chest 
Freezer, very good condi­
tion. Also 30’ electric 
range, copper tone and 17 
cu. ft. oopper refrigerator, 
all priced to sell. Call 853- 
2859 or 853-3140 after 5 
p.m.

For Sale-large amount of
used carpet. Good condi- 
tion. 853-2658.

For Sale-6 X 20 ft. goose­
neck trailer, two 9 X 7 ft. 
garage doors with windows, 
two 10 X 7 ft. fiberglass over 
head doors, upright freezer, 
896-2329.

New General Electric 
refrigerator/freezer 13  6
cu. ft. Almond color 
$300.00. Call 853-3161

Full-blood male, Australian 
Sheoard duddv. Only 1 left. 
Blue Merle and White. 
Great sheep and oow dogs.

Two jet skis, 
or 853-2998.

uaii 853-2880

Many assorted items from 
the school—desks, old 
chairs, lockers and much 
more. 9a.m. Aug. 13 be­
hind band hall by old kind­
ergarten.

M A N U F A C T U R E S  1ST 
QUALITY ALL STEEL 
BUILDING 52X125X25/ 
20X14 Door $15,995; 
3 6 X 7 2 X 1 8 / 1 2 X 1 4  Door 
$6,995 . Extended limited 
offer. 1-800-821-770 Ext 
803 or 417-763-2183.
150x450 ft. Butler Building- 
Over head cranes 20 ft. 
underhook-Office and living 
quarters-Central air and 
heat-Plumbed for 00mpress 
air-System and LP Gas heat- 
Ing 400 amp 3 phase.

Manufacturer’s 1st Quality 
all steel building 36x96x18- 
$6,995. Special Offer 
110-800-821-7700. Ext. 803 
or 417-736-2183.__________

House for sale: On Mert- 
zon Hwy., 2.04 fenced 
acres, carport, oovered pat­
io, fenced back yard, sto­
rage building, 3 bedrooms,
2 bath, Call 853-2795 or 
contact Mike Porter.

Approximately two acres 
fenced in Sonora, Texas. 
$150,000.00 firm. Call 
Mark Crider at 800-242- 
3017 25mtfnc.

Wanted

Lost

Lost, strayed or stolen-one 
Hereford yearling. Oscar 
Keeney.

lere will be a public 
hearing on the proposed 
budget for the Schleicher 
County Hospital District for 
the year 1982 at the regular 
meeting to be held in the 
Medical Center dining room 
at 7p.m. Aug. 17, 1981.

E.C. Peters, 
Secretary.

W.C. Crippin, Eddy Rin­
ser, Gene Edmiston and 
Jim Squyres were first 
place winners in the Eldo­
rado Golf Clubs’ ABC tour­
nament last week.

Second place went to 
E .W . W illiam son, Ben 
Hext, Dan Curtis and John 
Griffith. The team of John

Callison, Andy Anderson, The ABC tournament is 
Louise W illiam son, and held at 6 p.m. each Friday 
John Mitchell won third. at the golf course

Getting to  Paisano 

Lot o f Trouble

Babysitting in my home. 
Experienced. Call 853- 
2113.

Anyone interested in 
sharing a ride to ASU in San 
Angelo for classes from 8 
a.m. to 1 :05 please contact 
Rita Reeves 853-3178 or 
Leroy Reeves 853-2825.

Wanted: work hauling hay 
any day of the week. M ike 
Bellman

Wanted: yard work to do in 
Eldorado. Call 853-3003.

—J
Wanted: 5-6 girls ages
15-19 for Queen* s contes­
tants for Jaycee’s rodeo to 
beheld August 14-15. Must 
sail advance tickets. Trophy 
buckle to Queen and gift 
certificates for other candi­
dates. Contact Ray Ballew 
at 853-2153 after 5 p.m.

Help Wanted
Someone to keep two child­
ren (14 months and four 
years) in my home for half a 
day, five days a week. 
853-2149. _____________ _

WANTED—full-time 
salesman, office manager. 
College business and jour­
nalism background very 
helpful. Must be able to 
type and meet the public. 
Also, part-time help for 
office work. Apply in 
person at the Leader office.

It was fun when you got 
to Paisano, but going and 
coming wasn’t too much 
fun for the 36 young per­
sons from Eldorado who 
went to the church campout 
this year.

On the way to the annual 
event, the bus from First 
Baptist Church used 16 
quarts of oil and barely 
made it in to the camp.

Once there, the young­
sters attended Bible classes 
in the morning and evening 
and took part in several 
activities including swim­
ming and games.

The Eldorado Baptist 
youngsters tied into the 
Midland Baptist group in a 
football game and tied the, 
a remarkable feat consider­
ing the size of the larger 
church group.

Michele Walker partici­
pated in the talent show, 
and everyone enjoyed the 
fellowhship.

But trouble waS waiting 
for the Eldorado group as 
they returned home Satur­
day as the bus broke down 
several miles from Van 
Horn. Sharon Brown, acti­
vities director and one of 
the sponsors, got a ride into

town to get help. “ I hated 
to leave everyone else on 
that hot bus,” she said, 
“ but we had to get help.”

Several persons respond­
ed to her call for help 
including Mr. and Mrs. 
Herman Walker, and Jim 
Robinson, and several of 
those who attended picked 
up some of the youngsters 
off their way home, includ­
ing Danny Pina, John Paul 
Joiner, Mabel Blaylock and 
Frankie Hardy.

Most of the others on the 
bus went home on the 
Church of Christ bus sent 
from Eldorado.

The happy part of all 
their troubles is that the 
purchase of a new bus is in 
the making for First Baptist 
Church.

Several adults from Eldo­
rado attended, also, includ­
ing Billy Frank and Mabel 
Blaylock, Alma and Bill 
Williams, Les and Maudie 
Bassinger, Mary Robin­
son, Pam White, Billie 
Gayle McKinney, Becky 
H arris, Frankie Hardy, 
Ruth and Weldon Davis, 
Gayle and Peggy Mittel and * 
Cynthia Mittel.

alendar
Friday, Aug. 7-Square dance, Memorial Building, 8| 

|p.m.
Thursday, Aug. 6-Progress Council, noon, Dairy| 

I Mart
Saturday, Aug. 8-SCHLEICHER COUNTY DAYS, 

110 a.m. to 5 p.m., courthouse square; Country-Western| 
(jamboree, 8 p.m., Memorial Building.

Monday, Aug, 10-Beginning of Vacation Bible| 
ISchool at Baptist Church, 8 a.m ., Commissioner’s! 
[Court, 9 a.m ., courthouse.

Tuesday, Aug. 11-Meeting of the Southwest Texasl 
I Electric Cooperative, 7 p.m., courthouse lawn; CityJ 
|Council, 7:30 p.m., City Hall.

Wednesday, Aug. 12-Band practice begins, 9 a.m.,|
| high school band hall.

Thursday, Aug. 13-Pre-registration by phone fori 
[previous grade school students, 8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m.,f 
|FHA representative, 1:30-3 p.m ., courthouse.

Friday, Aug. 14-ABC tournament, 6 p.m ., goli 
|course; JAYCEE RODEO-parade at 4 p.m ., perfor-j 
|mance at 8 p.m., dance following.

Friday, Aug. 15-Last performance of Jaycee rodeo,|
| dance following.

Wednesday, Aug. 19-Probation officer, 9-4, court-| 
[house; Food Stamp representative, 10 a.m. to 3 p.m. 
Registration by phone for previous grade school 

[students.
Thursday, Aug. 20-Social Security Representative,! 

1-2:30 p.m., courthouse; Registration for grades seven, 
[eight and nine, high school; registration by phone for 
previous grade school students.

Friday, Aug. 21-State comptroller representative, 
19-10:30 a.m ., courthouse; Registration for grades ten,j 
11, and 12, high school; football scrimmage.

Saturday, Auk. 22~H*xt Memorial Golf Tournament J

m

Long-term
c re d it
ttia fs
p ro d u c tive .
The 
Land 

Bank,

IF WE DION T HflVL UUNHUtNut IN UUH

Q U A LITY  USED CARS
We Wouldn’t Offer Them To You!
bnop your  coruplete Hometown Auto Center u ;ki Sdvu.

1976 FORD

F-250 Pickup
% Ton -  A utom atic s h ift, Power s te e rin g  

and brakes -  A ir cond itioned

Bum per and G rill guards 

Good and C lean

0w used vehicles have been checke« 
and seat through our make- ready process.

Ton can bav with confidence at Kaa Bradaa Natan.

EAST TERMS AVAILASlfe

KEN MUDEN
NOTONS

i J l  J M  J m u w  lONÒ

Business
Directory

C H P oynor C onst. Co.

General O ilfield Construction 

24 Hour Call 884-2454 Big Lake 
Call 853-3064 Eldorado

UL WELL SERVICE
' ./ v ; j : ~ , - ’

W all Servicing-W ater Hauling

-Pump trucks 24 Hour Service 

Jdorado 853-2351 Sonora 387-3509

IN SU R A N C E  
F ir e , W in d s to rm , A u to  

an d  C a su a lty
Call TOM RATLIFF 853 2636

T ex-S u n  In s u la tio n
Residential - Commercial 

Free Estimates
Farris Nixon 853-2996

KERBOW FUNERAL 
HOME

S e rv in g  E ld o ra d o  & 
S o n o ra

Caty 853-2636 or 387-2*266 in Sonora

W h itten  L iq u id
..... . .. .Feed
Nutrene & Godbold Feeds

853-2944
, Steve Whitten, Manager Res: 853-2879

b R Y C T F ANFRS
LAUNDRY

4  UNIFORM RENTAL
DUST CONTROL 
MOPS MATS

THORP’S
212  SMain -853-2900

Leggett Construction

Brush C o n tro l- 
Tanks P its

24 hour Oil Field Services

J e ff Leggett

(915)853-3081

Specializing In
instruments,. Gauges, Meters & Controls 

For Oil & Gas Industry and Industrial 
Plants Sales & Service on OiKield and 
Industrial Instruments & Control

Eldorado Instrument &
Office 853-2506 Control Co. 24 H°Ur
Home 853-2624 Lldorado, Texas S e r v i c e

Henderson Waterweii,

W indm ill and Pump Repair 
£am  Henderson, Jr . 

853-2447

utler Supply Co., Inc.
Your Complete 

O ilfied Store 
East S treet 853-2503


