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There is no joy in Mud- 
ville or Dallas or the rest of the 
state of Texas this week. The 
Mighty Cowboys have struck 
out. What looked like an 
exciting Superbowl coming up 
has now taken on the hum 
drum aspects of just another 
football game

Is it possible there was a 
single television set in the 
state which was not tuned to 
the ill-fated game in San 
Francisco Sunday afternoon? 
And perhaps it was my imag­
ination. but I swear I heard a 
collective groan from the 
whole state when Dwight 
Clark made that miraculous 
catch in the end zone to finish 
the Cowboys off.

But the Cowboys are still 
our heroes. Danny White is 
not quite the cool customer 
that Roger Staubach was. but 
coach Tom Landry is still the 
best. Have you heard the story 
making the rounds about our 
favorite coach?

"A  pro-football player 
died and went to heaven, and 
on his first day there, St. Peter 
showed him around. Noticing 
that nobody was in the streets, 
the newcomer asked where 
everyone was. St. Peter re­
plied, ‘‘They’re all down at the 
football game.”

As the new arrival and St. 
Peter watched the game, the 
player was puzzled. "How 
come all the players have 
initials on their shirts instead 
of numbers?" he asked.

‘ ‘We think that's less con­
fusing than the numbers.”  St. 
Peter explained.

"W ell, I understand the QB 
for quarterback, the T for 
tackle, the LB for linebacker... 
but who's the guy on the 
sideline with TL on his shirt?” 
the player asked.

"Shhh," St. Peter said, 
"that's our coach, God. He 
thinks he's Tom Landry!"

m

When I first moved to the 
Texas Panhandle. I heard the 
natives jokingly say that the 
only thing between us and the 
North Pole was a barbed wire 
fence. But if you went outside 
Sunday or Monday, you sure 
would have believed the story.

I don’t mind a little cold, but 
that was ridiculous. The offic­
ial low temperature in McLean 
Sunday was I degree!! Of 
course, we've really had such 
a mild winter, that we 
shouldn’t gripe. The excessive 
cold has snown me one disad­
vantage of the weight loss I ’ve 
had since July. Those 16 
pounds were darned good 
insulationl (Wasn't that a 
sneaky way to brag about how 
well I’ve done at Weight 
Watchers?)

m
Ed and Carol Seiler came in 

the News office last week with 
the cutest bit of fluff I've ever 
seen Carol assured me that 
the tiny furry ball was a 
full-grown Yorkshire Terrier 
male, (in fact the proud father 
of a new litter of puppies.) 
Full-grown, the dog weighs 
just about one pound. She also 
said they were sweet natured 
pups in addition to being so 
cute.

After seeing that little dog. 
I'm thinking about trading in 
the bothersome Beagles for 
something not quite so ad­
venturous. Princess Belle 
Pepper, our young female, 
refuses to learn the etiquette 
of potty training, and thinks 
that my green carpet is just a
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Down The Court JU M P  HALL. OH slap the hall:1 A  Ms I eon tiger and u Letors 
f  ruit fin A ri<- to keep the hall team each other |Photo by Sally
Fay ays |

Tigeretfes Play For Championship In Wellington Tournament
The McLean Tigers and 

Tigerettes played in the four- 
school high school tournament 
in Wellington last weekend, 
with the girls playing for the 
championship.

Both McLean teams opened 
tournament play against Lake- 
view Friday evening. In the 
girls game. McLean coasted to 
an easy 54-39 win. with Nora 
Gately leading the scoring 
with 14 points. Leslie Stewart 
and Maria Eck each scored I I ,  
with Rhonda Herndon and 
Stacie Smith scoring 6 apiece. 
Susie Btllingslev scoring 4.
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Date High Low
I S  «2 66 18
1 6 82 SS 27
1-742 JO 12
1-8-82 S2 18
1 9 82 57 25
1-10 82 II 1
I I I  82 25 1

1-7-82 light snow-no cover

TED SIM M O N S

Ted Simmons
Announces
Candidacy

Ted Simmons is announc­
ing his candidacy for Gray 
County commissioner of 
precinct 4.

Simmons, who was first 
elected in 1974, is finishing his 
second term in the office. He is 
serving as vice-president of 
the West Texas County Judges 
and Commissioners Associa­
tion which covers 114 counties 
in the state. He is a member of 
the Hospital Corporation of 
America Coronado Community 
Hospital Board of Directors, 
and is on the board of directors 
of the Panhandle Regional 
Planning Commission.

" I think the county is in the 
best financial shape it has ever 
been in." Simmons said, "and 
I want to work hard to keep it 
that way. I am now turning my 
attention to improving the 
roads in this precinct "

Simmons, a native of Mc­
Lean. graduated from high 
school here He and his wife 
Sue live west of the city. He is 
a rancher They have three 
children Ted D. of McLean. 
Mark of Fulton. Mo . and 
Susan of Pampa

and Terri Glass scoring 2.
In the boys game. Lakcview 

got the lead in the first 
quarter, and never relin­
quished it. First quarter play 
ended with a lop-sided score of 
13 to 4 for Lakeview. McLean

Appraisal Board 
Sworn In Friday

From The Pampa News 
Five members of the 1982- 

1983 Gray County Tax Ap­
praisal Board were sworn in 
Friday, at the first meeting of 
1982. held at the Carver 
Educational Cei ter located at 
321 W Albert Street.

Gray County Clerk Wanda 
Carter administered the oath 
of office to board members.
R D. "Jim m y'' W ilkerson,
W E. Gething. Carl Kennedy, 
Llovd Hunt, and Dr. Robert 
Lyle. The five board members 
had taken an earlier oath last 
year and had acted as an 

? interim board through De­
cember 31.

Discussed at length was a 
presentation by Charles Rand, 
tax assessor collector for the 
Pampa Independent School 
District (PISD). He reviewed 
some of the duties and re­
sponsibilities of the appraisal 
district.

"W e can either hire our own 
chief appraiser and establish 
our own independent tax ap­
praisal office, which is what 
some of the counties do. or we 
can contract with an existing 
appraisal office. The single 
largest one in the county is the 
Pampa Independent School 
District of which Charles Rand 
is the tax assessor collector.
He is a hired employee by the 
school board to provide this 
function." said County Judge 
Carl Kennedy, a board memb­
er.

The board decided to re­
quest a proposal from the 
Pampa school district to pro­
vide services to do the entire 
appraisal. PISD will be sub­
mitting a description of what 
they plan to do and w hat it is 
going to cost the county wide 
appraisal district to contract 
with them at the neat taa 
appraisal board meeting 

The tax appraisal board will 
review the school district 
proposed contractural agree­
ment sometime during the 
latter part of January The 
meeting date has not been set 
at this time and will be 
announced later.

scored 10 to Lake-view's 13 in 
the second quarter, IS to 
Lakevicw's 14 in the third 
quarter, and lb to Lakevicw's 
13 in the fourth quarter to end 
the game S3 to 3S. Kevin 
Nicholvin again led the scor 
tng with 17 points Bobbt 
Sprinkles and Randall Wynn 
each scored 4, with Van 
Boucher. Theron Stubbs, Scott 
Stubbs, and Robert Swaner 
each scoring 2.

In Saturday's play. Mi 
Lean's girls lost to Wellington 
43 to 33 in the championship 
game. The two teams played 
8-8 even ball in the first 
quarter, but Wellington out 
scored the Tigerettes 19 to 6 in

an expensive second quarter 
Ihe Tigerettes were not able 
to get back on the scoring track 
hi the third quarter, either, 
racking in tnly 4 points for the 
whole pened The Tigerettes 
lound the basket again in the 
fourth quarter, outseoring 
Wellington IS to 10. to end the 
game 43 to 33. Nora Gately 
scored 9 points. Susie Bil­
lingsley and Leslie Skipper 
-•ach scored 8. and Maria Eck

and Rhonda Herndon each 
scored 4 in the battle.

McLean's boys lost their 
Saturday game to Quanah 32 
to 27. after leading 8 to 5 at the 
end of the first quarter. 22 to 
12 at the end of the second 
quarter, and 2S to 18 at the 
end of the third quarter. Kevin 
Nicholson scored 8 points. 
Bobby Sprinkles and Randall 
Wynn each scored 6, Theron 
Stubbs scored 4. and Dudlev 
Reynolds scored 3.

High School Students 
Named To Honor Roll

Students of McLean High 
School were listed on the 
Honor roll for the third six 
weeks in a roll released this 
week by principal Ron Cum­
mings

Listed on the 90 and above 
till were seniors Nora Gately. 
re rri Glass. Dudley Reynolds. 
Donna McAnear. Leslie Stew- 
■irt, Theron Stubbs, and Missy 
Billingsley; sophomores Allen 
I’atman. Dewaync Adamson. 
Don Bode, Darin Corley. Kev­
in McDowell. Tommy Milam. 
Bryan Smitherman; and

freshman John Glass.
On the 80 and above roll 

were seniors Cindy Glass. 
Carmel Moore, Billy Joe Skip­
per. Brenda Wilson. Susie 
Billingsley; juniors Kenny 
Acy. Debi Hutchison. Kevin 
Nicholson. Robbin Skinner. 
Stacie Smith, and Teresa 
Woods; sophomores Roxie 
Littlefield. Doyle Lee. Gregg 
Mann. Terri Pipes, Scott 
Stubbs. Robert Swaner. and 
Maria F.ck; and freshmen Bil­
lie Billingsley. Von Holwick. 
Scott Seiler, and Judv Stewart.

V ICK I W ALLS

Vickie Walls 
Will Run

For Clerk's Office
Mrs. Vickie Walls. Star 

Route 3, Pampa. has an 
nounced her candidacy for the 
seal of Gray County Diatrici 
Clerk.

Mrs Walls is a native of 
Pampa and is running for the
office on the Democratic lick 
et.

Her qualifications for the 
District Clerk position include 
serving the people of Grav 
County for the past four years 
She worked in the Gray Couaty 
Extension Service and in the 
office of the Gray Count» 
Judge. She feels that her past 
experience in serving the 
people has qualified her for 
this position of District Clerk

Mrs. Walls is married to 
C  M Walls. Jr They are 
engatrd in farming ia Gray 
and Roberts counties. They 
have two children.

The primary election will be 
held on May 1st and the 
general election will be held in 
November The deadline ft* 
candidates to file is Februarv 
1. 1982

Honor Students For 
Junior High Announced

McLean Junior High 
sludents were listed this week 
on the honor roll for the third 
six weeks by principal Dorman 
Thomas.

Listed on the 90 and above 
roll were sixth graders Jeff 
Parker and Angie Reynolds; 
seventh graders Shawn Crock­
ett, Angie Glass. Mark Mc­
Carty. Colleen Orrick. and 
Kim Wigmton, and eighth 
graders Melanie Billingslev. 
Wendy McDowell. Bob Pat 
man and Lee Ann Tate 

Listed on the 80 and above

roll were sixth graders Jim 
Anderson, Tony Hambright, 
Terri Lee. and Linda Reid; 
seventh graders Billy Beck, 
Melody Collins. Tanya Cum­
mings. Andrew Harris. Rita 
Hensley, Clint Herndon. Lisa 
Hickman. Trevor McDonald. 
Dedra Watson, and Samantha 
Harris; and eighth graders 
David Adamson. Vicki Arm- 
bnster. Chet Bohlar. Gina 
Gardner. Martin Gately, Jodi 
Green Russell Littlefield. Jim 
Ridgway. and Dominic Via.

Elementary Roll Given
Principal Dorman Thomas 

announced the honor roll for 
the McLean Elem entary  
School for the third six weeks 

Listed on the 90 and above 
roll were first graders Patsy 
Barker. Rhonda Glass, and 
(Juillian Rutherford, second 
graders Cody Gabel. David Johnson. Deatry Magee. Lisa 
McClellan. Tuffy Sanders, and 
Missy Young, fourth graders 
Laura McCarty and Deanna 
Sprinkles and fifth graders 
tXdlie Havnes Misty Magee.

Darla McAnear. and Karen 
Williams.

Listed on the 80 and above 
roll were first graders Peggy 
Adams. Michael Barker. Holly 
Hefley. Bills Henntg. Sissy 
Hill. Katncia Littlefield. Becki 
M cCarty, David M cCarty, 
Clay Reynolds, and Johnny 
Walker; second graders Barry 
Btschnff. Dale Cole. Jetrett 
Coleman. Juluuia Crockett. 
Grace DeLeon. Joseph Flores.

See ROLE. Page 2

School
Busine

Contracls
Following a short execu­

tive session Monday night, the 
McLean school board of trus­
tees save school business 
manager Shirley Johnson a 
SSOO raise and a one-year 
contract, and «tended super­
intendent Jim Rutherford's 
contract to a three-year con- 
trad and added SS00 Ruth­
erford is now drawing $4500 
above Ihe stale schedule, and 
Mrs. Johnson receives SJ250 
above slate.

The executive session and 
contrad approval came at the 
end of the session w here board 
members discussed a variety 
of subjects. Mrs. Jane Simp­
son. the school's insurance 
agent, explained that the com­
pany she represents had 
reached no settlement yet on 
the school's claim for damages 
resulting from a lightning 
storm in September. Board 
members have already paid 
more than $47.000 in repair 
bills for the damage Mrs. 
Simpson explained that in a 
loss exceeding $40.000, the 
company's officials in Dallas 
have lo approve the payment 
She said they would base their 
payment on the claim on a 
report from an independent 
engineer The engineer has 
visited McLean but has not 
submitted his formal report to 
the company yet. she said But 
trom his oral report lo her. she 
said that ihe company will 
probably refuse to pay for the 
plumbing or ihe pain.ing 
which resulted from the 
plumbing.

"The engineer told me that 
he thought the plumbing 
damage was 'coincidental'... 
that's ihe word he used," 
Mrs Simpson told the board 
She said that the engineer said 
the pipes were old and rusted, 
which caused part of the 
damage

"I'm sorry this has gone on 
so long," Mrs. Simpson lold 
the board. "I've done every­
thing I know to do to expedite 
payment, and I think you've 
been very patient."

Mrs Simpson told the board 
" I do think this is a good 
company, but they've delayed 
low long."

Board president Jim Allison 
said " I think it's ridiculous 
that an engineer could say the 
lightning didn't shake those 
pipes loose w hen we had water 
everywhere the next morn­
ing." Rutherford told the 
board 'We (he and Mrs. 
Simpson) have been riding 
these people in Lubbock and 
Amarillo . We just need more 
time. The company's going to 
have lo meet with us before 
this is settled ”

Rutherford said the plumb- 
ing and excavation costs a- 
mounted to about half the total bill mi far "We've got the school hack in operation, hut 
wc haven't started any other 
repair yet," Rutherford said.

Mrs Johnwin told the board 
that thev have already lost 
$3700 in interest on a time- 
deposit thst has been held out 
to pay the repair bills

The board approved a 
motion that if settlement was 
not reached by Feb. 1, the 
hoard would seek legal action 
against the company. Board 
member Howard Gipson told 
Mr*. Simpson "W e all sure 
appreciate your work. We 
know this delav is not your 
fault."

Following the discussion 
about insurance, the board set 
the trustee election for April 3. 
Two three-year terms will be 
open. Board members Howard 
Gipson and Lioyd Hunt are the 
two w hose terms are expiring

Appointed as election judge 
was Roger McCracken, with 
Pat Durham. Sue Simmons, 
and Mary Powell as clerks. 
Judy Morris and Emma Jean 
Tate will serve as absentee 
clerks.

The board approved the 
junior-senior banquet at the 
Coronado Inn in Pampa April 
16. High achool principal Ron 
Cummings said that the stu­
dents had had no problems 
going to Pampa since the 
policy was changed two yean  
ago

Cummings also told the 
hoard that the Band Boosters 
were planning a two-day trip 
in late April to a concert at 
Lake Sandy at CarroHoa. The

Manager
Renewed
organization has $2.000 in a 
saving account which will pay 
expenses for Ihe trip if the 
school will allow ihe group lo 
take a large school bus The 
board approved Ihe request.

Lloyd Hunt, a school board 
member and a member of the 
Gray County Appraisal District 
board reported Monday night 
that the appraisal board had 
voted last week to contract 
with the Pampa school tax 
office for the county's tax 
business. Hunt said he was 
delegated lo write a letter of 
proposal to Charlie Rand, the 
Pampa appraiser to ask for a 
proposal for the office. The 
county board will probably 
meet again before the end of 
the month.

Attending the meeting were 
Rutherford. Mrs. Johnson. 
Mrs. Simpson. Cummings.tad 
board members Allison. Hunt. 
Gipson. James Hefley. Tony 
Smitherman. J.C . McAnear. 
and Darrvel Herndon.

Band Students 
Attend Contest

Mrs. Frances Adamson 
took five McLean Junior High 
band students to All-Region 
tryouts Saturday at River Road 
High School in Amarillo, and 
although none made the honor 
band, they gained a great deal 
of contes. experience, Mrs. 
Adamson said. ' 'Our kids were 
playing AA high school music, 
and they just worked their 
hearts out." she said “ but 
they were competing against 
kids from AA and AAA 
schools.'' She said that the 
band students did well in the 
contest, and gained some 
practical experience from their 
participation.

Attending the contest were 
Angie Glass, clarinet; Shawn 
Crockett, flute; David Adam- Min, coronet, Chet Bohlar. 
coronet; and Bob Patman, 
drums.

McLean Splits 
Games With Lefors

The McLean boys and 
girls split a pair of games with 
the visiting Lefors Pirates 
Thursday night in McLean 
when the girls won 48 to 28. 
and the boys lost .38 to JS.

Tigerette Nora Gately pared 
the McLean girls with 12 
points, as Maria Eck scored 9. 
Leslie Stewart scored 10. Susie 
Billingsley scored 7, Rhonda 
Herndon and Terri G lass  
scored 4 each, and Stacie 
Smith scored 2. The hoat team 
jumped to an early lead in the 
first quarter, and led 26 to 14

M A R Y  CLA KK

Mary Clark 
Announces 
For Clerk

Mary Clark ia announcing 
her candidacy far Ihe office of 
Gray County District Clerk 

Mrs Clark, a native of 
Pampa. is running for the 
office on the Democratic tick­
et.

She hss served aa chief 
deputy for four years under 
the current district clerk. Mrs. 
Helen Sprinkles 

Reared in Pampa, she is a 
graduate of Pampa High 
School and has lived la  Pampa 
for the last 35 years with her 
husband John. They have four 
children: Mike Claih df Pam 
pa. Johnny Clark of Houston. 
Cheryl Flury of AmariNo aad 
Jackie Bragdta of Amarillo.

The Democratic primary la 
May I, with thug  
foe act for Nov.2.

<
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OPINIONS
H E W S AB E WBiTTEN BY UNDA HAYNES, UNLESS 
OTHEBW ISE NOTED I f  YO l H A VE AN OPINION ON ANY  
CL’U E N T  SU B JE CT  WE WELCOME YOU» SIGNED LETTEBS.

Adding Fu«l To Tho Fir#
la il true that each person loves Reaganomics, until the 

budget-cutting blade nicks his little personal domain? If it is. 
then I stand guilty as accused.

Thanks to David Stockman. President Reagan, el. at. 
beginning this week. The McLean News, along with all the other 
small town weekly newspapers and others who hold second 
class mailing permits, will be paying a whopping SO percent 
increase in our mailing rates for out-of the-county newspapers

When I bought this newspaper in 1478. our average cost to 
ntail the papers each week was Sib. Now. the cost will be S40 
every week, and that's a big jump in three years 
Oul-of-the-cnuntv papers cost 3.2 cents each to mail last week, 
but this Thursday's paper will be b cents each, just for mailing 
In-county rates have increased from 3.4 cents per pound to 3.4 
cents per pound, and from 1.8 cents per paj>er to 2.4 cents per 
paper.

All this means that my costs will go up drastically, and when 
the costs for this paper go up. only one thing can happen the 
subscribers and the advertisers will have to pay more And. as 
any elementary economics student can tell you. that is called the 
inflationäre spiral

I understand the fact that we are all caught in this squeeze, 
and I don t gripe loo much when my groceries go up. or I have to 
pay more for the gasoline at the service station or this year's 
blouse costs 20% more than the same style last year But 
something deep inside me screams "Foul!" when an agency of 
the government, which is so piously claims to be fighting 
inflation, dumps a load of gasoline on the inflationary fire by 
such a sweeping rate increase

And have you noticed how quiet the increase has been? The 
public was forewarned about the 20 cent stamp for several 
weeks, but this rate increase has been an extremely well-kept
secret.

This rate jump is just another in the long series of government 
actions, which will prove a point It’s easier to be out of power 
and complain about how the power structure is handling the 
problems, than it is to solve the problems Reagan was going to 
stop inflation without high unemployment, remember' Read the 
papers lately? Reagan was vehemently opposed to draft
registration---- until last week Reagan's first job was to
dismantle the Departments of Energy and Education, but......

Regardless of which |>arty is in. and which party is out. the 
results almost inevitably will be the same That big. sleeping 
bureaucracy which realls runs the country cannot be changed 
quickly, and certainly not by politicians making glib promises 
that they know are impossible to keep.

So next week. I'll pay $40 to mail these papers, and next 
summer, you'll probably have to pay a dollar or more for your 
paper each year.

bv Barry McWilliams

In tha 1945 movía To H air and Hare No I Lauren Bacail't 
tinging voice wet dubbed in by 14 year old Andy Williams
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pertect piece ol grass. She is 
still the snoopiest dog I've 
ever known, peering into all 
the wastebaskets to check for 
hidden goodies. Like her fath 
er. Andrew Pepper, she really 
thinks she's human. She pre 
fers to eat table scraps, and 
really likes to sleep on a 
human's bed Many mornings 
I have awakened with some 
thing warm snuggling up to 
my back, only to discover a 
Beagle in mv bed! Bleh!!!

And if she were not enough 
trouble. Andy is trying to set a 
new record for visits to the vet 
by a living dog. He has no 
sense whatsoever when it 
comes to attacking a dog. or 
two or three, that are five 
times his sire A few weeks 
ago hr was tossed like a rag by 
a giant St. Bernard, and 
suffered several puncture 
wounds from that fray. Last 
week, according to a friend 
who observed the quarrel, he

watched two German Shep­
herds and the same St. Bern­
ard as they were fighting. 
Now. a fight between dogs of 
that si/e is pretty evenly 
matched, but for some reason, 
old macho Andy watched a few 
minutes, and then bounded 
into the tumbling mass of 
growling dogs.

He now has a rather fetch­
ing looking scar by his right 
eve. and while it does make 
him look mysterious and

ROLL
Thomas Green. Daniel Harris. 
Tanner Hess. Clifford Immel. 
Chris Littlefield. Clay Mc­
Cracken. Keith Robinson. Lee 
Erin Stubbs. Heidi Svfrett. 
and Shanna Warren; third 
graders Michael Acuna. Keith 
Garrison. Hollie Hauck. Fran 
cis Hickman, and Melissa

GAMES-
at half-time.

In varsity boys' action. Me 
Lean led at the end of the first 
quarter 4 to 8. but lost the lead 
IS to 13 in the second quarter, 
and were never able to keep it 
again Kevin Nicholson led the 
scoring with 20 points. Dudley

Continued From Page I
Reynolds. Van Boucher, and 
Bobby Sprinkles each scored 
4. and Therein Stubbs scored 3.

The teams were scheduled 
to play Samnorwood at Sam 
norwood Tuesday night, hut 
the results were too late f«r 
press lime

Oil And Gas Production 
Reporting Is Easier

AUSTIN. Tex.. Dec 24 
Oil and gas operators in Texas 
will find their monthly produc­
tion report to the Railroad 
Commission easier to do in the 
future thanks to simpler forms 
approved by Chairman Jim 
Nugent and Commissioners 
Mack Wallace >nd Buddy 
Temple.

The CommioKv s Oil and 
Gas Division has revised the 
production reporting forms to 
eliminate needless duplica­
tion. according to David Gar 
lick, the division's Assistant 
Director for Planning and 
Administration

"Under the present pro­
cedure." he said, "an opera­
tor who produces from both oil 
and gas wells must file four 
production reports with the 
Commission each month: the 
P I. P 2. and P IA  A 2A lone 
form) with each for casinghead 
gas and gas well gas. Under 
our new procedure, the same 
operator would file only two 
reports; the P-l and P-2."

Although the new forms will 
be ready in 1482. the planned 
start date fur their use is not 
until January I. 1483 Thus, 
the first report using the new 
forms will be for production 
during January. 1483 That 
production report is due to the 
Commission bv February 28. 
148.1

Before the new forms can be 
put into use. producers and 
operators across the state have 
to be introduced to the forms 
and understand how to use 
them The Oil and Gas Divi­
sion plans to explain the new 
forms at seminal t throughout 
the state during 1482 While 
this education process is going 
on. the old forms will continue 
to be used

Garlick said the P I and P-2

have been redesigned to in 
dude the information n-poned 
on the P IA  St 2A firm In 
simplifying these reports, wc 
have also reduced ihe suh 
stantial costs to ojieraiors as­
sociated with the reports." 
he added, "costs which in­
clude monthly preparation and 
filing time, postage and re­
cords and retrieval time "

Texas' booming ml and gas 
industry has generaied a tre­
mendous amount of paperwork 
for the Commission, which 
regulates some 180.000 pro 
ducing oil wells and 40.000 
producing gas wells in the 
state In an average month 
more than 41.000 oil and gas 
production reporting forms as 
sent to Ihe Commission, or 
more than half a million forms 
annually.

That total represents a St 
percent increase over 1950, 
and a similar increase is pro­
jected for 1482 The elimins 
non of the P 1A A 2A form will 
cut more than I SO.000 forms 
annually, which represents a 
30 percent reduction and a 
savings to the Commission of 
$25.000 a year

The redesign of the P I and 
P-2 forms also makes filling 
them out easier and faster 
Instructions on the back have 
been simplified The Commis­
sion mailing address is printed 
on the form so it will show 
through the standard window 
envelope when folded Shaded 
lines running across the face of 
the forms help operators keep 
words and numbers in align 
ment.

The P-2 form will be printed 
in yellow so Commission 
handlers can easily distinquish 
it from the P I (green ink on 
white paper.f.

DIATHS
BI'KLAH GREGG

Buelah Gregg died Jan. 
11 at her home in Bridgeport 
The funeral was to have been 
Wednesday in Bridgeport She 
was 84

Survivor* include two child­
ren. Jack Gregg and Fksrene

rhomas. three grandchildren 
five great-grandchildren 
three brothers. Trav Arm 
strong of Santa Paula. Calif . 
Cat Armstrong and Pete Arm 
strong of Long Beach. Calif . 
and one sister. Loretta Batlev 
of McLean

—  Continued From Page I

handsome. (like a duelling 
scar on a By runic hero's face.) 
he almost sacrificed an eye for 
that particular mark.

I w ill not trade the Beagles 
off. however, not even for a 
dog as darling as that Yorky. 
Whether I like to admit it or 
not. I'm as crazy about them 
as the rest of the family. 
Besides, who else can you 
dejiend on to always be glad to 
see you w hen you come home?

Continued From Page I

Thompson; fourth graders 
Donald Hams. Alicia Rey­
nolds. Robcn Sanderson. Jas­
on Sheets. Danna Watson; and 
fifth graders Dale Barker. 
Deanna Billingsley. Skyla 
Bryant. Jerry Cathey. Tiffany 
Lope/. Grant Mann. Kara 
Tale. Kvle Woods, and Ronna 
Young.

Senator  
Lloyd B en tsen

Watching
W a s h i n g t o n _________

Ihi-rr s been a lot of rhetoric about excessive government regu­
lation out ol W usliiiigion over the past two years—the phrase 
regulatory reform" has cut through Congress and the media 

like a hu//xuw through bamboo
let, little progress has been made in identifying the scope of 

itic problem, much less in reducing the regulatory burden.
Ii s tunc lor action on regulatory reform—not more talk 
live sears ago I had the Joint Economic Committee do the 

in depth siudv ol live sosts ol ledcral rules and parvrwork 
l'ii report suggested that the cost ol regulation to the U.S. 
ivmorns was m excess ol $1(11) billion a year—and that was 
.uk in 1478 I then drew up proposals to control ihe regulatory 

prose" and make ii more cost cl tec live.
Sonic ol mv ideav became law and others were included ill a 

t alter Administration I xcculivc Order that laid out new policy 
intended io reduce ihe amount ol ledcral regulation When I 
learned ihat this order did not apply to a host ot independent 
ledcral agencies, such as the Federal Trade Commission, I pre 
p.ued a bill requiring that these independent agencies, loo. as­
sess and reduce ihe economic burden of their regulations.

I hat proposal was adopted by President Reagan and now 
hums the heart ol the new regulatory review mechanism at Ihe 
O lticcof Management and Budget

Kt-ii-nlly I introduced legislation instructing all government 
agencies to reduce the burden federal regulations imjiove on 
lurniets. ranchers and small business by 2? percent over the nest 
two years.

One ol iwo primary provisions m my bill requires the Presi­
dent to estimate the costs of all major rules and paperwork re­
quirements which the ledcral govcrnmcnl imposes on farmers, 
ranchers or small business. The President, under the bill, 
would lollecl the information annually and provide it in a report 
in Congress not later than January 31 of each year.

The second maior provision in the bill requires the head of 
each federal agency to reduce the burden ol its major regula­
tions and its paperwork requirements on farmers, ranchers and 
small business by 25 jierecnl over the nest two years.

I'm not suggesting that all government regulations are evil or 
counterproductive Many do necessary jobs and do them well. 
Hut the amount ol ledcral regulation has grown lar too rapidly 
over the past decade. The f  ederal Register, a compilation of 
all the rules, regulations and fiats of the government, expand­
ed from 20.000 pages in 1470 to 87,001) this year.

Mv 25 percent burden reduction givev federal agencies a dear 
and simple largei and nmciablc tor slashing regulations bedevil 
mg larmcrv, ranchers and small business.

COW POCE»

LINES
by
LEM

0 ’RICKK
The Cowboys once more bit the dust, 
Their well-oiled machine turned to rust; 
The Forty-Niners won,
And Joe Montana's gun,
The Pokes Super bubble did bust!

Senator B ill Sarpttlhts
Reports

1, \ H H I U I .  H K . r . n V I K S  \  K K  U . r n

AUSTIN ~ On January 1, 
the new law we sponsored 
to give a tax break for Texas 
gasohol became a reality. 
Events in the world of agri­
culture this year show the 
law could not have come at 
a belter time.

In a yeat of tremendous 
grain harvests, the price 
makes farming seem like it's 
just not worth it. We hope 
the gasohol industry will 
create a new market for 
grain products, and in turn 
stabilize (he price of gram 
and allow farmers lo make a 
profit for a change

The gasohol bill gives 
gasohol a five cent a gallon 
tax credit. This should 
make gasohol competitive 
with unleaded gasoline, and 
entice people lo buy it. 
Gasohol will he marketed 
under other names, such as 
super unleaded, in many 
markets.

Three gasohol plants for 
Texas already are on the 
drawing board These 
plants will cost a tolal of 
$200 million. Two are 
planned for the Panhandle 
with one in Dumas and one 
in Muleshoe These are just 
the major plants. Many 
smaller plants are planned, 
and some already are opera­
ting When wc consider the 
added benefits of new in­
vestment. these two plants 
should be worth about $600 
million to the Panhandle's 
economy.

This money will come in 
the form of supply con­
tracts for construction, con­
struction jobs for workers

and engineers and jobs for 
people to run the plants 

In addition, there should 
be new markets for grain 
The gasohol bill specifies 
that the gasohol he made 
from renewal resources 
Now. that means grain, 
although other sources un­
doubtedly will apppear in 
the future

This bill puts Texas on an 
even basts with other states 
Every state that surrounds 
Texas already had an ex­
emption for gasohol 
now we have joined them.

Now the decision of where 
to put a gasohol plant in the 
Southwest United States 
will be made on the basts of 
merit, not on the basts of 
where the tax credits are.

Texans never have needed 
an unfair advantage All we 
need is a fighting chance, 
and that's what the hill gives 
to Ihe Texas gasohol 
industry -  a fighting 
chance.

We need your help in sup­
porting the gasohol indus­
try in this slate. Buy 
gasohol. It's good for your 
cars and trucks, and good 
for the Texas farmer. As 
food becomes more and 
more important, we need to 
make sure our farmers stay 
in business long enough to 
sec them through the bad 
times they have had re­
cently.

We also need your help in 
shaping our future tax and 
energy policy for this state 
Please write to Senator Bill 
Sarpaltus. P O . Box 12068, 
Austin, Texas 78711.

A squirrel may scrounge at much at twenty bushels of 
nuts end roots and lauds end put them in e number 
of cachet scattered around his territory. However, 
squirrels hive terrible memories and are often un­
able to find even a tenth of these caches later on.

A four eyed fids, 
us two When the ftdt ewtens just below 
the top huff of each 
face and the bottom bed tees ur

There'« good new» for 
American« eccordmg to the 
Bureau of Labor Stati»tic», 
the rate of inflationary 
pnee increase» it stabilizing 
in aeveral major American 
dliea, and even decreaung 
somewhat in other» The 
greatest decline« in the in­
flation rate are occurring in 
the energy field, where 
declines in pnees on fuel 
nil and eleclncity have been 
measured for the sixth con­
secutive month.

Now an insurance com 
pany that ranks 20th among 
the 1,800 American life 
inaurance companies is 
doing its part to contribute 
to the fight against mfla 
lion Phoenix Mutual Life 
Inaurance will be increaaanf 
the life inaurance coverage 
on more than 380,000 of ita 
policies with no increase in 
premium payments Some 
of the coverage increeaea 
will be aa high as 4 5 percent, 
with an average uicreaae of 
about 15 percent

These changes pro 
vide cost reductions lo the 
company that i n  
p M x l directly along to
policy holder«

i Jake, you have get te atari e.erctam t ve get you 
entered In the krone rtdtn' in Denver'"

CO W PO KES is brought to ydu by the friendly folk» at the

Amerieao National Bank
Ip McLe

7 7 + 2 *1

McLUZxns member FD 1C
M R
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Wilson’s Machine Shop Opens For Business In McLean

The Pioneer Study Club 
met J m . 7 at the home of 
Jacque Riley. Refreshments of 
hot punch, pound cake, cook­
ies. ham and cheese bits, and 
nuts were served to the mem­
bers as they arrived.

Clara Hupp presided at the 
business meeting. Roll call 
was answered with New 
Year's resolutions broken.

Mary Lou G lass used 
"Daughtersof Eve" by Hobbs 
as the background for her 
discussion of Women of the 
Bible.

Attending were Bonnie 
Fabian, Mary Lou Glass, Kim 
Graham. Clara Hupp. Judy 
Orrick. Wanda Lamb. Eleanor 
McCarty. Pat Walker. Jacaue 
Riley, and Ruth Magee.

O U R  C A R  SILH O U ETT E C A L E N D A R S FO K  1982 
A K E  H E RE.

W E W OULD A P P R E C IA  TE O U R C U ST O M E R S  
C O M IN G  B Y  A N D  P IC K IN G  TH EIRS U P

though Don Wilson began 
* u<ting in his dad's machine
Shq, in Pampa when he was
onl! seven years old. the 
°l*"ng last week of Wilson's 
Mfchine and Welding Shop in 
Mdetn is the first time he has 
owied his own shop. The 
»null, well-equipped job shop 
i* -csted at SOI E. First in 
Hu|h Gately's building.

*ilson will cater to the 
K'Kral trade, he said. His 
shop will be able to manufac- 
tuit any kind of metal part. He 
opects a great deal of his 
b“»ine»s to come from the oil 
fad. Wilson Mid. although 
Fnday he was manufacturing 
replacement parts for wind­
mills "Any metal part that 
ha* to be ordered for replace-

JANI SIMPSON 
INSURANCS AOSNCY

Lester Sitter, Susan and 
Scott of Denver. Colo, spent 
New Year's weekend with 
their grandparents. Mr. and 
Mrs Evan Sitter.

•••
Mr. and Mrs. Chria  

Moore and Brian Hogue of 
Woodward. Okla. visited re- 
ceatly with the Kinneth Ham- 
bnght family.

Mrs. Mary Powell spent the 
night with Mr and Mrs. Don
Powell in Canadian.

•••
Clyde Richard Brown under­

went surgery in St. Anthony's 
Hospital last Tuesday. Mr. 
and Mrs Clyde Brown and 
Mrs Mary Powell visited with 
him.

eee
W.J. Carnes returned home 

from Shamrock where he had
been a patient in the hospital. 
Mand Carnes are in Amarillo 
with their daughter Merla 
Kaye and her family.

•••
Mr and Mrs. Jeff Railsback 

»ere in Dumas recently and 
spent the night with their son. 
George Railsback and his
family, then they visited their 
daughter. Mrs. Margie Gamer 
and her family in Amarillo. 

•••
Louise Johnson and Kathy 

Danner were in Pampa on 
business on Saturday.

•••
Mr and Mrs. Claude Lester 

visited in Lubbock with their 
daughter. Mrs. Ronnie Gooch 
and family and with other
relatives.

•••
Mrs. Kate Mac Donald re­

amed home Monday from her 
aephews. Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Morgan in Canadian. Before 
going to Bill's. 4 days ago. 
Kate had had a lengthy stay in 
Coroaado Hospital in Pampa 

•••
Mr. and Mrs. Allen Craw­

ford of Amarillo and Mr. and 
Mrs. Kerry Anderson and 
children. Jessica and Nathan, 
visited during the weekend 
with their parents and grand­
parents. Mr and Mrs K W 
Hambright.

•••
Mrs. Loree Barker returned: 

home following a three weeks 
visit in Seymour with Miss Ola 
Barker and other relatives and 
in Lubbock with Mrs. Anna 
Belle Lamb and other rela­
tives.

•••
Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Wil­

liams of Amarillo spent the 
night with Mr. and Mrs. 
Howard Williams and also 
visited with the E.L. Watson 
family.

Mr. and Mrs. R.J. Turner 
have been in Olton on busi­
ness. They also visited their 
daughter, Mrs. Glenda 
Roundtree and family in Little­
field and their son. Gary 
Turner and family in Amarillo.

Mrs. Mary Powell has re­
turned home from a visit in 
Richardson with Mr. and Mrs. 
Terry Letteer and in Dallas 
with Mr. and Mrs. Bob Coffee 
and children. Grant. Dustin 
and Jarrad and in Mesquite 
with Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Powell.

Cutting A Pip•
Pioneer Study Club Hears Program

W O RK IN G  O N  O N E  o f  the machine v at Wilson % Machine and 
Welding is Larry Christopher |Photo by Linda Haynes]

Machinist At Work D ON  W ILSON  PROPRIETOR o f  W ilson s Machine and 
Welding Shop which opened in McLean last week, is shown at a 
large drill in his new shop. (Photo by Linda H aynes|

»V."
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WERE CELEBRATING OUR FIRST ANNIVERSARY  
IN BUSINESS AND WE WANT TO 

THANK YOU FOR YOUR ENCOURAGEMENT 
A N D  SUPPORT..~AND PURCHASES.

THE POTPOURRI SHOP
212 N Mam McLean. Teiaa

I

I

men! usually coats a lot." he 
said. "W e can manufacture 
the part here at a savings for 
our customers. ”

Wilson has one full-time 
employee now, Larry Christ­
opher. but plans to add a 
part-time worker soon. " If  the 
business grows as we are 
expecting, we will add other 
employees." Wilson said. He 
said that there was enough 
general business in McLean 
for right now. And if the oil 
production gets busier around 
McLean, his business should 
boom.

Wilson explained the mach­
ines in his shop. Three of them 
were shipped in from over­
seas. Wilson said that he

bought the machines and paid 
the freight on them for less 
money than he could buy 
comparable material in the 
United States. "A n d  the 
machines are better made." 
he added, saying that the 
machines will hold a closer 
tolerance. A huge Summit 
lathe, made in Yugoslavia, will 
swing 27 inches. A milling 
machine, also Summit brand, 
was made in the Republic of 
China. It's a universal mach­
ine Wilson said, and will do 
almost any job necessary. The 
third large machine in the 
shop is a Summit radial dnll 
made in China, which Wilson 
called a "general purpose" 
machine.

Wilson has spent the last 
few months as a teacher and 
inspector in a machine shop in 
Amarillo He and his wife 
Paula live in Alanreed with 
their daughters Brenda, i  
senior at McLean High School, 
and Karen, a sophomore. For 
nine years. Wilson was the 
manager of Lake McClellan, 
but previous to that he had 
spent all his time working in a 
machine shop. Wilson said his 
dad owned the Grayco Mach 
ine Shop in Pampa for several 
years.

Wilson said that he hoped 
everyone would feel welcome 
to come by and see the new 
shop, and inquire about his 
work

McLean Briefs
Sidney Kunkel returned 

home Friday from a months 
visit in California. He accom­
panied his son. Laverne and 
Faye Kunkel of Dumas and 
they visited another son, Glen 
Kunkel and his family and the 
Laverne Kunkel'a son. Burl 
Kunkel and his family in Vic­
torville.

•••
Rev. and Mrs. Archie Coop­

er have returned from a trip to 
Sacramento. Calif, to visit 
their daughter. Mrs. Wynona 
Yates and children. Tracy and 
Carta.

no*
Mr. and Mrs. Elmo Whaley 

visited their daughter. Mary 
Kesterson in Pampa Hospital 
on Monday.

Mrs. Lil Reynolds returned 
home Sunday after several 
days visiting in Wheeler.

•M
Mr. and Mrs. Claude Lester 

and Mrs. Loree Barker were in 
Amarillo on business on 
Thursday.

•M
Mrs. Jewell McCurley re­

turned home Tuesday follow­
ing a six weeks visit in Long­
view with her son. Weldon 
McCurley and her brother. 
Frank Dunn and their families.

•••
Visiting recently with Mr. 

and Mrs Ercy Cubine were 
their daughter. Mr and Mrs. 
Neil Quattlebaum. and their 
grandchildren. Cindy, a stu­
dent at Trinity University at 
San Antonio and Kaye, a 
student at West Texas Univer­
sity at Canyon.

•M
Mr and Mrs. Ted Glass 

visited Miss Margaret Glass in 
Shamrock General Hospital on 
Thursday. •••

S .A . Cousins underwent 
surgery in Coronado Com­
munity Hospital in Pampa on 
Monday.

eee
Joe and Joe Kelly Clark of 

Lefors. Janet Smith and Stacey 
and Timothy Hess of Amarillo 
spent Sunday with Chick 
Wood and Lil Reynolds.

•••
Bro. Joe Walker. Fern Boyd

and Dorothy Patterson visited 
with S.A. Cousins and Rose 
Steel in Pampa Hospital on 
Monday.

•M
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Glass 

spent Saturday and Saturday 
night with Mr. and Mrs. A N. 
Hardman in Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Dut­
ton and Nicky of Grandbury 
and Mr and Mrs. Gifford 
Martindale and children of 
Pampa visited with Mrs. 
Minnie Erwin.

•M
Mrs. George Terry, Mr. and 

Mrs Bill Terry and Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Glass. Allison and 
Garrett are in Colorado this 
week.

The Senior Citizens of 
McLean will host a blood 
pressure clinic Thursday. July 
21. from I p m until 4 p.m. at 
the Young-At-Hearts building 
at 112 N. Main

Mr and Mrs. Dale Steel 
are the parents of a daughter. 
Lacey Lee. born Jan. 9 in 
Coronado Community Hospital 
in Pampa. She weighed 8 lbs.. 
10 oz. and was 21 inches long.

Mr. and Mrs. Miachel Vogt 
and son Chad of Houston 
visited here during the Christ­
mas holidays with Mr. Vogt's 
sister and husband. Mr and 
Mrs. Cecil Reynolds and child­
ren. Lisa. Frances. Kerry. 
Frank, Mike. Dudley, and 
Mitch.

The Vogts also visited with 
his grandmother. Mrs. LuciHe
Cullison.

•M
Miss Alice Hommel of Dall­

as visited here during the 
Christmas holidays with her 
neice. LuciHe Cullison. She 
also visited with her brothers 
and wives. Mr and Mrs Ollie 
Hommel of Alanreed. and with 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hommel 
and families of Garendon. and 
with her sister. Mrs. Annie 
Smith, and with her neice and 
husband and family. Mr. and 
Mrs Ray Howard Miller of 
Amarillo

Grandparents are M rs. 
Mary Dwyer of McLean. Bud 
Steel of McLean and Jackie 
Steel of Eufala. Okla. Great­
grandmother is Mrs. Dm o r  
Dwyer of McLean.

The
Busy

Needle
SU PP LIES FO R

NEEDLEPOINT  
COUN TED C R O SS STITCH  

KNITTING A N D  CR O CH E T IN G

H IG H  WA F 287 SO U T H  O F  CA UTION U G H T  
H E D LE Y

M ON DA Y THROUGH FRIDA Y 9 5  JO  
SA T U R D A Y  9 4

856 4251

New Arrival

TIGER CUP SPECIAU
FILLED WITH

YOUR FAVORITE BEVERAGE
NOW ONLY 65(1

GET YOURS WHILE SUPPLY LASTS!

\
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DOWN
M E M O R Y

LANE
VN*k

10 Years Ago 
E M Bailey. Ed.

The McLean Volunteer Fire 
Department answered a total 
of 64 calls during the year of 
1971. They include 28 in Gray 
County, 6 in Wheeler. 3 in 
Donley County. 17 in the city 
limits and 10 false alarms and 
other runs.

t t t
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Wil­

liams of Denver. Colorado 
visited their parents the O.J. 
Tindall's and the Howard Wil­
liam's over the holidays. They 
also visited in the Charles 
William's home here and with 
the Don Tindall family in 
Borger.

t t t
Doug Richards, a McLean 

High School graduate was 
among the December grad­
uates at West Tetas State 
Universitv at Canvon He re-

ceived the Bachelor of Bus­
iness Administration degree. 
Doug it the son of Mr and 
Mrs John Richards of Dumas 
and grandson of Mr and Mrs. 
Neville Back of McLean.

20 Years Ago 
Jack Shelton. Ed.

Construction of a big new 
building to enlarge the facil­
ities at Marie Foundations in 
McLean is etpected to get 
underway as soon as the 
weather permits. Tom Green­
wood. production superintend­
ent at the local plant, an­
nounced that a contract had 
been awarded to John C. 
Jones of Clarendon to erect the 
new structure adjoining the 
present building on the east, 

t t t
McLean and the entire Tea- 

as Panhandle remained in a 
bone chilling deep-freeze to­
rtai Inaccurate thermometers

left the city without an official 
low reading for the two coldest 
nights of the winter, however, 
weather observer Pete Ful- 
bnght estimated that the mer­
cury reached down to 3 de­
grees below zero Tuesday 
night and perhaps as low 
Wednesday.

t t t
Lee Welch, superintendent 

of McLean schools for the past 
two years, was presented 
another one-year contract by 
the board of education Mon 
day night.

30 Years Ago 
Lester Campbell. Ed.

Luther (Luke) Henley Wed­
nesday authorized The News 
to announce his candidacy for 
re-election to the office of 
constable. Precinct No. 5. 
serving the McLean and Alan- 
reed areas. Henlev is now

Notes From Your County Agricultural Agent

YELLOW  W HEAT 
Wheat farmers have been 

noticing some of their wheat 
fields turning yellow. Gener­
ally. these are drvland fields 
that have not been fertilized. 
That in itself is the first clue as 
to the cause. 1 believe.

There has been no real 
difference between irrigated 
and drvland fields for the most 
part this fall.

However, the shortage of 
soil nitrogen may not be the 
only cause Earlier this fall 
considerable wheat on the 
South Plains was hit by leaf 
rust Rust has also caused 
yellowing in some of our 
fields With rust, the oldest 
leaves show the most damage 
At first, there is a small yellow 
fleck on the leaf The spore 
enlarges for a short time and 
becomes a round, rough spot 
beneath the leaf surface Soon 
the bump becomes pale in 
color, then yellow, and breaks 
to release many golden yellow 
rust spores The spores blow 
to other leaves and start the 
whole process again It takes 
about twelve days under good 
conditions, which are mild 
temperatures and long periods 
of leaf wetness Spores will not 
infect a dry leaf and they soon 
pensh under extremely high or 
low temperatures

As rust progresses, each 
generation is more damaging 
Continual loss of leaves to rust 
is something like heavy graz­
ing The plant will survive with 
good moisture conditions but 
make little progress. It is a 
good idea to graze a rusted 
field so as to use the forage 
and reduce the production of 
rust spores.

Spores don't grow at low 
temperatures and many may 
freeze. The rust organism 
generally moves south to the 
San Antonio area to spend the 
winter in more favorable con­
ditions. Then in the spring, it 
moves slowly northward Usu­
ally we have very little trouble 
with leaf rust on wheat in the 
spring but this past year was 
an exception Most plant 
pathologists blamed the prob­
lem on an unusually mild 
winter last season and timely 
spring moisture.

One solution for fall rust 
prevention is to delay planting 
as long as possible Another is 
to use rust resistant varieties 
Sturdy. Sage. Osage, and 
Newton have resistance to leaf 
rust built into their genes 
They will have fewer rusted 
spots, and the postules will be 
much smaller If rust is the 
cause of your yellow, ther isn't 
much the wheal farmer can do 
to prevent rust on this year's 
wheat

Now. let's get back to 
discussing the possibility of a 
nitrogen deficiency as the 
mam current cause of wheat 
yellowing We have taken 
some good wheat crops off of 
our dryland fields in recent 
years Generally speaking, we 
have made above average 
yields during the last three 
years-, therefore, we have tak­
en more nitrogen out of our 
•oils than we usually expect. 
This coupled with the fact that 
we had an unusually wet fall 
which resulted in excellent, 
rapid growth of wheat Also, 
some fields more or less 
become water logged and had 
water standing on them for a 
few days. This has tended to 
use up available nitrogen at a

Dr. Brack W.
CHIROPRACTOR

_____k  A t  Vr i i

rate faster than what our 
dryland generally has avail­
able

Now if we only knew if the 
spring would be as wet as the 
fall has been. That is the 
unknown factor that prevents 
us from knowing what to do. I 
recommend that where you 
have yellow fields of wheat 
that vou collect a soil sample to 
have it analyzed and verify the 
available nitrogen present If it 
is short on nitrogen, then you 
may want to top dress with a 
nitrogen fertilizer around 
March before or at the booting 
stage I would guess about 
20-30 pounds of actual nitro­
gen per acre This would 
depend somewhat on the 
moisture prospects at that 
time.

CALL TOM1
Featured on "TO M I" as the 

new year gets under way will 
be discussions on the outlook 
for feed grains and pecans; 
farm issues; and a look at 
sheep, goat and cattle number 
and cattle on feed.

TOM KTelephone Outlook 
and Market Information) pro-

vides producers with up-to- 
date information on a variety 
of subjects.

Recorded messages are 
prepared by Extension Service 
economists, using the latest 
available information 

By dialing 713 845 TOMI, 
anyone can get market and 
outlook information seven 
days a week. 24 hours a day.

Information scheduled to be 
available through TOMI dur­
ing January is as follows:

Jan 16-18-Feed Grain Sit­
uation. Roland Smith 

Jan. 19-22--Cattle on Feed 
Analysis. Ed Uvacek 

Jan 23-26-Peanut Situa­
tion. Johnny Feagan 

Jan 27-29-Sheep and Goat 
Numbers, Ernie Davis 

Jan 30-Feb. I-Cattle In­
ventory. Ed Uvacek 

TOMI can help you keep 
abreast of the latest hap­
penings in various commodity 
markets and also provides 
other pertinent information 
designed to help you with both 
short-and long-range plan­
ning.

Quotable Quotes
Great things are done 

more through courage than 
through wisdom

German Proverb 
He who hai health has hope; 

and he who has hope has 
everything

Arab Proverb 
To a friend one must close 

one eye. To keep him-two.
Norman Douglas 

Ultimately the bond of all 
companionship, whether in 
marriage or in friendship, is 
conversation

Oscar Wilde
They deem me mad be­

cause I will not sell my days for 
gold, and I deem them mad 
because they think my days 
have a price

The more joy we have, the 
more nearly perfect we are.

Benedict de Sptnpza 
He who asks a question is a 

fool for five minutes, he who 
does not ask a question re­
mains a fool forever

Chinese Proverb 
The shy man usually finds 

that he has been shy without a

cause, and that, in practice, no 
one takes the slightest notice 
of him.

Robert Lynd
Thousands of people have 

enough talent to become fam­
ous. It is the need to use it 
which is lacking.

Katherine Butler Hathaway
The whisper of a pretty girl 

can be heard further than the 
roar of a lion.

Arab proverb

What an author likes to 
write most is his signature in 
the back of a check.

Brendan Francis
To know the *ood is to react 

against the bad. Indifference 
is the mark of deprivation.

Marya Mannes

The game of history is 
usually played by the best and 
the worst over the heads of the 
majority in the middle

Eric Hoffer
An imaginary ailment is 

worse than a disease
Hanan J . Ayaiti

From the ¡ t in  of The
serving his first term in the 
office, having been elected in
1950

tt t
Buster Day of Pampa was a

visitor here Friday.
t t t

Mr and Mrs. Thelter Mc­
Pherson and daughter of Am­
arillo are here visiting his 
parents, Mr and Mrs. Bryan 
McPherson. Thelter has re­
cently been discharged from 
the service.

t t t
Mr. and Mrs. Oba Kunkel

and Vickie Sue. and Mrs. 
Buma Kunkel attended the 
25th wedding anniversary cel­
ebration of Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Kunkel Sr. in Groom Sunday 
afternoon.
40 Years Ago 
T.A. Landers. Ed.

No paper available for this 
date.

Tax Estimate Due
The fourth, and final, 

installm ent of estimated 
Federal tax payments on 1981 
individual income is due by 
January IS, 1982. the Internal 
Revenue Service says.

This installment should be 
paid using declaration voucher 
No. 4 found in the Form 
1040 ES package. “ Declara­
tion of Estimated Tax for 
Individuals.“

Taxpayers whose antici­
pated income changed during 
1981 may have to file an 
amended declaration. Space if 
provided in the estimated tax 
package to compute an amend­
ed estimate.

For more detailed informa­
tion. the IRS publication S05. 
"Tax Withholding and Es­
timated Tax." is available free 
by calling the IRS forms/tax 
information number in the 
local telephone directory.

Hightower 
Visits Office
Vernon. Tex,-Congress­

man Jack Hightower of Texas 
and Congressman Dave Mc­
Curdy of Oklahoma inspected 
the Altus. Okla. Cotton G as  
sing Office of the Department 
of Agriculture and questioned 
officials there about problems 
in grading that have beer 
experienced this year by cot 
ton fanners In the meeting in 
Altus Tuesday, both Con­
gressmen expressed concern 
over the number of complaints 
over low grades and that com­
parisons by private graders 
have been averaging twenty 
dollars a bale higher.

The director of the Altus 
cotton classing office Wiley 
Cam. said that officuls out of 
the M em phis. Tennessee 
office had complained that 
grades out of Altus were 
higher than they should be 
compared to cotton classed in 
other parts of the country

Congressman Hightower 
stated. "The grading problem 
is compounded this year by the 
low, low prices of cotton We 
both want farmers to receive a 
fair grade on their cotton 
Farmers are at the mercy of 
the government graders A 
difference of twenty dollars a 
bale could mean the difference 
between staying in business or 
going under. I have met 
already with officials of the 
Department of Agriculture in 
Washington. D C . and I plan 
to visit the Memphis. Ten­
nessee office to go over the 
problem as soon as possible.''

M cLtan  News
by Sam Haynaa

50 Years ago 
T.A. Landers. Ed.

County officers were al­
lowed deputies by the com­
missioners court at the regular 
session Monday. Sheriff Lon 
L. Blanscet will have one paid 
deputy. Floyd Archer, and 
four unpaid deputies. Harris 
King. Raymond Harrah, Abe 
Davis and Nels Dodson. Tax 
Collector T.W. Barnes will 
have one full-time deputy. 
Jack Back, and five part-time 
deputies. Mrs. Louise Miller 
Dunn, district clerk, will have 
one deputy, Miss Marie Bastin 
County G erk Charlie Thut's 
two deputies are Miss Ola 
Gregory and Miss Katherine 
Howell. Tax Assessor F .E . 
Leech will have one deputy, 

tt t
Sheriff Lon L. Blanscet does 

not use tobacco in any form.

and shentt s ottice loungers 
have not been using good aim 
at the county cuspidors in his 
office lately, so he has banned 
chewing in the offu;  with 
some neatly lettered signs 
which read, "N o tobacco 
chewing in this office If you 
expect to rale a gentleman, 
you must not expectorate on 
the floor." 
t t t

A few cases of scarlet fever 
have been reported at school 
and Sup. Boswell and the 
health authorities insist that 
children be kept at home if 
they show any signs of illness 
until it is known that they do 
not have a contagious disease

60 Years Ago 
M .L. Moody. Ed.

Miss Nona Cousins enter­
tained a number of friends 
with a dinner party at her

home north of town Sunday. A 
bountiful dinner was served, 
after which the guests spent a 
very delightful afternoon. The 
following were present: Miss­
es Laura Hill. Margaret Mil­
ler. Frankie Mae Upham and 
Lucille Stratton; Messrs. A.L. 
Baxter. L.M. Jones and R. 
Dunkle.

t t t
Dr. Montgomery reports the 
following births: Mr. and Mrs. 
J.C . Johnson, last Saturday, a 
girl; Mr. and Mrs. M.A. Nix, 
last Saturday, a girl.

t t t
News from Alanreed: Miss­

es Thelma. Ellen and Bernice 
Hall were McLean visitors 
Saturday.. We are indeed glad 
to see Rufus Kennedy able to 
enter school again, after hav­
ing blood poison in his hand.

One other trouble with this 
country is that it spends more

Hòmemaker NeU/$
You might say it is the 

"contest time of year." Why 
not get involved? For those of 
you who friends and family 
compliment as a great cook or 
for those of you who enjoying 
serving-there is a contest for 
each coming up soon, 

soon.

TEXAS C O W  BELLES B E E F  
C O O K O F F

If you are 18 years of age 
and enjoy cooking with beef- 
enter the Cowbelles Beef 
Cook-Off. Any beef recipe 
using chuck, round, rump or 
fresh brisket in any form may 
be entered. The dish must

contain a minimum of two 
pounds of beef and not more 
than five pounds. Cooking 
time should not exceed four 
hours.

For the preliminary recipe 
judging, a contestant must 
submit an entry form and his 
or her recipe, postmarked no 
later than Februarv 10. 1982 to 

the State Chairman at the 
following address: Texas 
Cowbelles Beef Cook-Off. 5501 
Interstate 40 West. Amarillo. 
Texas 79106.

From the recipes submitted, 
a team of judges will select the 
top five recipes. The finalists 
expenses will be paid to Ft.

In The Kitchen
by Lindt Hoynot

Occasionally I run across 
i  recipe that rapidly becomes a 
family favorite. This one has 
one unusual step in it, but it is 
very simple to make. Try this 
reape, even if you don't 
normally like casseroles. I 
think you'll love it. It came to 
me from Tammy (Mrs Steve) 
Carter, who says it is one of 
her family's favorites also

CH ICKEN  FRIED  RICE  
In an electric skillet or 

wok. heat 2 T. oil. Saute 'A c. 
chopped onions and 'A cup 
chopped celery; brown lightly. 
Add one can sliced water 
chestnuts and I small can

sliced mushrooms, and 1 flat 
can of chicken or turkey. Cook 
together for a few minutes.

While the mixture cooks, 
prepare enough minute rice to 
equal two cups cooked rice. 
Reserve.

Scrape everything in skillet 
to one side of the skillet. 
Scramble an egg. Add the rice. 
Combine '/> cup water with 'si 
cup soy sauce. Pour over 
mixture. Put lid on skillet and 
let mixture cook slowly for a 
few minutes. Feeds many, 
many people depending on 
how hungry they arc!

School Menu
BREAKFAST

Thursday Jan. 14: Creamed 
Beef on Toast. Juice Milk. 
Friday Jan. IS: Cold Cereal. 
Toast, Juice. Milk.
Monday. Jan. 18: Hot Cereal. 
Biscuits. Jelly. Juice. Milk. 
Tuesday, Jn. 19: Sausage. 
Gravy. Biscuits. Juice. Milk. 
Wednesday. Jan. 20: Cin­
namon Rolls. Juice. Milk.

LUNCH
Thursday Jan 14: Tacos, sal­
ad. Ranch Style beans. Sop- 
apillas. honey.
Friday. Jan. 15; Hot Steak 
Sandwich, gravy, salad, french 
fries, jello w/ fruit.

"All doors ara open to 
courtesy.'' Thomas Fuller

Monday, Jan. 18: Pizza, salad.
corn on the cob. chocolate 
brownies.
Tuesday, Jan. 19: Soup and 
Sandwiches, potato chips, car­
rot sticks, strawberry short­
cake.
Wednesday. Jan. 20: Corn 
Dogs, mustard, french fries, 
baked beans, annamon rolls.

TUESDAY, JAN. 19

QOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOOf i
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on lace paint than on nouse 
paint.

70 Years Ago 
A.G. Richardson. Ed.

The town windmill went to 
pieces during the storm last 
Saturday and is tied up waiting 
for repairs from the factory, 

t t t
McLean is on the verge of a 

coal famine but it is believed a 
car or two will arrive before 
any serious inconvenience is 
experienced

tt t
J R.G. Bird has purchased 

the R E. Dorsey farm north­
east of town and will occupy 
same this year, having moved 
last week

t t t
Billie Biggcrs suffered a bad

freeze one day last week while 
going from (own to his school 
at Peterson Creek.

Worth to prepare their dishes 
for judging at the Texas Beef 
Cix>k-0ff March 4-5. For more 
information, contact my office.

NATURAL FIB ERS FA SH IO N  
REVIEW

The llth  Annual Natural 
Fibers Fashion Review is 
being planned for the 1982 
Southwest Farm Show. The 
fashion contest and show will 
be held on March 6 in Ft. 
Worth. The contest is open to 
any homemaker from the 
Soulhwest Farm Show States 
of Texas. Oklahoma, and New 
Mexico who is involved in 
agricultural production or an 
agriculature-related business.

The fashion review is de­
signed to promote the use of 
natural fibers produced in the 
Southwest and to emphasize 
excellence in garment con­
struction and fashion in home 
sewing. Garments entered in 
the show must be made of a 
minimum of 50% cotton or 
50% wool and/or mohair.

The competition will have 
four divisions: day wear, 
evening wear, mother and 
child, and former grand award 
winners Prizes will be award­
ed to first, second, and third 
place winners in each division.

Entries must be submitted 
by February 19, 1982. Contest 
rules and entry blanks may 1>c 
obtained from the CountyEx-' 
tension Office.

or gathering.
4. Don't rush for a bargain 

that takes more out of you than 
it saves for vour pocketbook.

5. Don't knock yourself out 
trying to park vour car in a 
space loo small for a scooter.

6. Don't bother to quarrel 
over small thmgs--like a game

7. Let the other fellow think 
he's right when it really 
doesn't matter.

8. Conserve your mental 
muscle for things that count, 
and never bother to wrestle 
with the inevitable, the im­
ponderable. or the insignifi­
cant.

U PCO M IN G  EV E N T S  
January 14-Extension Home­
maker Club Officer Training- 
2:00 p.m., Courthouse Annex 
Meeting Room 

house Annex Meeting Room.
January 21-District TEHA  

Training Mceting-Mary Ellen 
Harvester Church of Christ.

TH O UGH T FOR THE D A Y  
The art of being wise is 

the art of knowing what to
overlook.

H O W  TO B E L A Z Y  A N D
LO VE IT '

It's great to be lazy if you 
know how. It spares your 
heart, saves your energy, re­
laxes your niind -and you need 
not feel at all guilty about it if 
you confine your laziness to 
these approved ways, recom­
mended bv a psvchologist:

1. Be too lazy to frown, 
fidget and worry.

2. Don't wear yourself out 
carrying the needless weights 
of grudges, prejudices, and 
envy.

3. Listen more than you talk, 
and see how much better you 
feel after almost any meeting

C O M P LE T E  
¡2D BED HOSPITAL  
K IT CH EN
H I G H L A N D  G E N E R A L  
HOSPITAL  
1224 N. H O B A R T  
[Hobart A Kentuckyl 
PA M P A . TEXAS  
T U E SD A Y JA N U A R Y  I I  
9:30 a.m.
Sale will begin promptly at 
9:30 a.m. in the kitchen of 
the hospital:

C O M P LE T E  K IT CH E N

THE FOLLOW IN G WILL 
B E  SOLD BEGIN N IN G A T
I 00 p.m.
Surgical-Delivery-Xray- 
Laborxtory-Recovery-3 Pro- 
fexray fables-Profexray  
Videx Collimastcrs-Eureka 
X ray T u b es-P ro fexra y  
Radiographic Timers-Kodak 
RPX-0 Maticprocessor- 
Xray View Panels-Jewett 
Refrig Blood Bank. Model 
3950-Centnfuges-Culture 
T esters- International 
Regrig. Centrifuge-Coulter 
Counter-Coulter Hemo- 
globinomcter-Contour 
C h a ir  Am es M icrotom e  
Cryostat-Castle Thermatic 
60 Autoclave-Refrigerators- 
Photometers-2 Shampainc 
Delivery Tables- 3 Sham 
paine Surgical Tables-G.E. 
Defibrillator-G.E. Patient 
Monitors-Surgical 
Lamps Vacuum Pumps-Re- 
susitator- Aspirator- Bennett 
Therapy Units-Panasonic 
Patient Monitors-Isolettes- 
L A R G E  I N V E N T O R Y  
O F F IC E  E Q U IP M E N T  A 
FU RN ISH IN G  
126 Hill-Rnm Electrical 
Beds-Side Chairs-Striaght 
Chairs-62 Baumanometer 
B lo o d  P r e s s u r e
Night Stands-Chests of 
Drawers SPE CIA LS: Tele- 
med Teleprinter. Model 
PR02EX- Kohler Power 
Plant Generator-Air Com­
pressors- Maintenance 
Equipment A  Supplies 
1973 Chev. C60 Dump 
Truck. 5 yd 1968 Chev 
C60 Dump Truck. 5 yd.- Air 
Force Surplus Port. Air 
Comp, mntd on 4 wheel 
trailer
H U N D R E D S  O F  IT E M S  
TOO N U M E RO U S TO U S T '  
IN SPECT  Sal , Jan 16. 
10:00 to 5:00. Mon., Jan. 
18. 10:00 to 5:00.
TERM S: Cash or Cashier's 
Check TxE-012-0275 For 
Brochure Contact:

’w est ÇAta t i
AUCTIONEERS

«101 WIS1 141M
AM ÄIIUO T| I  AS to« U l «t?i
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JOIN THESE BOOSTERS
IN SUPPORTING THE McLEAN TIGERS BY ATTENDING THE GAMES:

Mag## Ranch 
HaBums Backhoo Service 
Haynas Triangle Ranch 
Corinno's Styl* Shop 
Lamb’t Flowor Shop 
Cowboy Drhf* Inn 
Puckott’s Grocory 
McLoan Varioty 

Thomas Nursing C*nt*r 
Gty of McLoan 

McLoan Hardwar* 
Brost RO Ranch 

Jan* Simpson Agoncy

McLoan Cattle Co., Inc 
Windom’s Auto Supply 

Boyd Moador R*al Estât*
Th* Potpourri Gift Shop 

Dairy Qu**n 
Amorkan National Bank 

Bontloy’s Fortilixor 
Th* Jak* Hess II Family 

Donworth Un* Camp
John Nash 

Toxaco Wholesale
BAB Engin* Servie*

Dixi* Restaurant

William’s AppKanc*
BAB Electric 

Tony’s Appliances 
Fosh**’s Toxaco 

Th* McLoan Nows 
Tod A Sue Simmons 
Smithorman Farms 

Barkor Redi-Mix 
WH-Mart

Mcloao Atlas Plumbing 
Mortal's Boot Shop 

McLoan Votorinory CRnk 
Mr. A Mrs. F J. Hots

TIGER K E VIN  N ICH O LSO N  slrams Io shool over Ihn Pirole 
artender dornig ihr Lefors McLran game last werk. ¡Photo hv 
Sallv Havnes\ I
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Cubs Sw«tp To Easy Victory Over Groom
McLean's junior high 

basketball learns hosted 
Groom Monday night to two 
district games and a junior 
varsity game In the opening 
act am of the evening the two 
school's B teams boys played, 
tvith Groom beating McLean 
>0 to 4. Groom outscored Mc­
Lean 10 to 2 in the first 
quarter, and easily held the 
lead for the rest of the game 
Scoring for McLean were An­
drew Harris with 3, Clint 
Herndon. Bob Patman, and 
Keith Christopher, each with 
2.

In the girl s varsity game 
McLean lost 28 to 18 after 
falling behind 6-2 in the first 
quarter The Cubettes began 
to catch up in the second 
quarter, with the half ending 
14 to 10. but Groom outscored 
McLean 6 to 3 in the third 
quarter, and 8 to 5 in the fiaal 
period Scoring for McLean 
were Melanie Billingsley »ith 
7. Wendy McDowell with 4, 
lee  Ann fate with 3, and Jem 
Ann Rice and Tanya Cam 
mings each with 2.

In the boys varsity game.

McLean turned the tables on 
the visitors and jumped to a 
first-quarter lead of 10 to 2. 
and ended first half play with a
score of 18 to 7. The game 
ended with the Cubs winning
34 to 23. Martin Gately con­
tinued his outstanding play, 
leading the Cubs with 22 
points David Adamson scored 
12. Donnie Smith scored 3 and 
Jim Kidgwav scored 2.

The Cubs and Cubettes will 
be playing in the McLean 
Junior High Tournament

Cubtttes, Cubs Win Pair From Miami

T K jt RETTE NORA G A T E D  iump% for the boil during the 
¿r/fvs game last week. |Pkoiu by Soilv Ntiyne*]

LIBRARY 
NOTES

* S m  I

McLean s Cubs and Cub- 
ettcs travelled to Miami Jan. 7 
and brought home two district 
victories.

The Cubettes set the pattern 
in the first game of the 
evening when sharp shooter 
Melanie Billingsley dropped in 
20 points to lead the McLean 
quintet in their 42 to 18 
victory The first half of play 
was even between the two 
teams, with McLean leading 
14 i,, 10 at the end of the 
second quarter, but McLean 
scored 16 points to Miami's 2 
in the third quarter to ice the 
game Others scoring were 
Jem Ann Rice with 13 points. 
Lee Ann Tate wnth 7, and 
Wendv McDowell with 2.

In the boys' game, a hot 
handed Martin Gately sunk 23 
points to lead the Cubs to then 
commanding sK'torv of 46 to 12 
over Miami The Cubs jumped 
to an early 12 to 2 lead at the 
end of Ihe first quarter, and 
the game was never in doubi 
from that point. McLean 
scored 27 points to Miami’s h 
in ihe first half, and 14 to 
Miami's 4 in the second halt 
for the win Other scoring was 
from David Adamson with 10 
Dominic Via with S and Kirk 
Anderson. Chet Bohlar. Don

me Smith, and Darren John 
son. each with 2.

Coach Joe Riley was pleased
with his boys' play. "It was a

VOW YOl AVOW A HO UT 
STRANGE BEASTS  NOW U ) l  A W H  t v/vf-t/ 

H O M E S
E ncvclopcdia Britannica 
Educational Corporation 

Two new sets of books for 
youngsters about animals, are 
now available at Lovett 
Memorial Library, complete 
with 8-irack tapes that go 
along with the books to be 
studied

"Now You Know About 
Strange Beasts" furnishes ac­
curate and well-researched in­
formation on dinosaurs, 
animals of the ice age. mon­
sters and mvths. sharks, and 
strange animals of today, and 
will be an invaluable asset to 
boys and girls studying these 
particular subjects

“ Now You Know Animal 
Homes'' is for younger child­
ren and with the use of

wonderful illustratkms and 
simple and easy to understand 
language, presents them a 
wonderful opportunity to study 
the homes and habitats of such 
interesting subjects as gruily 
bears, bees, beavers, moles, 
badgers, earthworms, otters, 
bats, octopi. squirrel, birds, 
fish. ants, spiders, turtles, and 
many of the larger animals 
such as buffalo, kangaroo, 
and gorilla.

Both ot these editors will be 
greatly enjoyed by youngsters 
from the lower grades up. and 
will be a great help in many 
school projects. The eight 
track tapes add an even more 
enlightening dimension to the 
study of these great books 
presented by the Ency clopedia 
Bnttantca Educational Cor 
poratum You will find them 
both available at Lovett Mem 
onal Library

Most Ptopls Eat Too Much 
Sodium, Hoalth Export Warns

Although sodium is vital 
to good health and nutrition, 
most people consume more of 
it than they need. And the 
T e ias  Medical Associaiton 
says restricting one's intake of 
this mineral element often 
requires more than just cutting 
back on table salt 

Salt, the common name for 
sodium chloride, is the largest 
single contributor of sodium to 
the human diet but only one of 
many sources of sodium in 
food The list also includes 
brine, salt pork, self-rising 
flour, and sodium compounds 
such as monosodium gluts 
mate «MSG), sodium citrate, 
sodium saccharin, baking soda 
and baking powder.

Jump Starting Can Be Dangerous
When cold weather, that 

seasonal enemy of car batter 
ics. starts blowing across Tea- 
as. it’s time for the annual 
reminder from the Teias So­
ciety to Prevent Blindness on 
the hazards involved in jump­
ing a car battery.

Falling temperatures rob a 
battery of its efficiency En­
gine oil becomes thicker, mak­
ing the battery work harder to 
turn the engine over.

"When this happens many 
motorists find themselves on 
me end or the other of a set of 
booster cables," says Jack B 
O'Neill of Houston. Prevent 
Blindness Safety Chairman 
This commonplace practice of 
borrowing starting power from 
one battery to another resulted 
in more than 20.000 injuries 
last year, nearly two-thirds of 
them involving the eye."

Carelessly connected jump­
er cables, he explained, can 
produce a spark that can cause 
an explosion with the com­
bustible gases that a battery 
normally emits. Battery acid 
burns are particularly danger­
ous to the eyes, he noted

To minimize the risks in­
volved. Prevent Blindness has 
prepared a safety sticker 
which gives motorists 
easy-to-follow instructions for 
jump starting a car with a dead 
battery. On it. the Society 
makes the following recom­
mendations.
BEFO RE ATTACHING THE  

CA BLES
•Put out all cigarettes and 

flames A spark can ignite 
hydrogen gas produced by 
battery fluids

•Make sure the cars don't 
touch each other Set parking 
brakes and automatic shifts of 
both cars to Park (manual 
transmissions to Neutral), and 
turn the ignition off

•Take off the battery caps 
if removable, and add water if 
it is needed Check for ice in 
the battery fluid Never 
jump-start a frozen battery! 
Replace the caps and cover 
with a damp cloth

•Do not lump-start unless

G z & 7 iiz a
The obtest roin mint in 

the Western Hemisphere is 
the Casa de Moneda de 
Mexico, world renowned for 
over four eenlurie* for the 
quality and craftsmanship 
of their coinage Recently, 
Banco de Mexico, the gov 
ernment'a federal reserve, 
commissioned three new 
coma — the first gold bul 
lion corns in 80 years — 
from the Casa de Moneda 
The new coma are the 
Mexican one-ounce, the 
Mexican halfounce and the 
Mexican quarter ounce 
They could make enduring 
and original gifts of fold.

both batteries are negatively 
grounded and the same volt­
age American cars have eith­
er 12-volt or 6-volt batteries 
Check owner's manual (Own 
crx of foreign cars should 
check thetr operating manuals 
for emergency starting direc­
tions.)

ATTACHING TH E CABLES  
•Clamp one jumper cable 

to the positive pole of the dead 
battery Then clamp the other 
end of the same cable to the 
positive pole of the good 
battery.

•At the booster battery, 
connect the second cable to the 
negative pole Then clamp the 
other end of that cable to the 
stalled car's engine block on 
the side away from the bat­
tery.

•Start the car with the good 
battery and then the disabled
car

•Remove the cables, first 
from the engine block and the 
booster car's negative term­
inal and then from the positive 
poles.

For maximum eye safety, 
the Society advises everyone 
working with car batteries or 
standing nearby to wear pro 
tective goggles to keep battery 
fragments and chemicals out 
of the eyes Should an accident 
occur and battery acid get into 
the eyes, immediately flush 
them with water continuously 
for IS minutes. Then see a 
doctor.

The Society has listed these 
procedures, step by step, on a 
4" by 8" yellow vinyl sticker 
which has a permanent adhes­
ive backing The sticker can be 
affixed to any dean, dry 
surface under the hood or kept 
inside the car's glove com­
partment. To obtain a sticker, 
send 25 cents and include a 
self addressed envelope, to 
Prevent Blindness. P O. Box 
2020. Houston. TX 77014 
TSPB is an affiliate of the 
NatKinal Society to Prevent 
Blindness, the nation's oldest 
voluntary health orginizatKin 
dedicated to sight conserva­
tion.

Sodium is so prevalent that 
most people get more than 
enough without adding salt-- 
from the food and water they 
consume Sodium is included 
in most processed foods and is 
present in water either be­
cause it occurs naturally or is 
added by the use of soteners in 
some community water sys­
tems.

The people most concerned 
are those on sodium-reslncled 
diets for treatment of various 
heart, liver and kidney ail­
ments. or for hvpertensKin 
thigh blood pressure). An 
estimated 23 milium to 6 
million people in ihe U.S. have 
diseases or disorders that may 
require control of sodium or 
potassium, a common salt 
substitute Excess vidium in 
their diets can increase the 
volume of water in body 
tissues and bring about swell­
ing or a condition called ed­
ema

Sodium-conscious consum­
ers should be w ary of products 
labeled "salt free." They 
might not be sodium free The 
U.S Food and Drug Admin­
istration cites the case of a 
brand of potato chips that was 
being promoted as hating no 
added salt The agency found 
that an ounce of the chips 
contained 175 milligrams of 
sodium, a "significant amount 
for any consumer on a sodium- 
restricted diet." (A safe daily 
intake of sodium fee a healthy 
adult is 1.100 to .1.300 milli­
grams ) The FDA has indi­
cated that saying a product 
containing sodium is "salt 
free" is misbranding.

Although ingredient lists on 
the labels of most products do 
not give the amount of sodium 
they contain, the U.S De 
partment of Agriculture has 
published a booklet with the 
average amount of sodium in 
784 items.

W*st Ttxans Can Still Ordar Seedlings
LU B B O C K  Some species 

have been sold out. but it is 
mu too late for West Texans to 
purchase several varieties of 
windbreak tree seedlings from 
the Texas Forest Service

The Service's West Texas 
Nursery in Lubbock still has 
two varieties of conifers and 
five tvpes of hardwood seed 
lings available for the 1481-82 
planting season, which ends m 
late March.

According to Bob Fewin. 
silviculturist at Lubbock, (he 
conifer species still available 
are Austrian pine and ponder 
osa pine These 6 to 12-inch 
pine seedlings are grown in 
individual dual cells. 30 cells

Fewin said the hardwoods 
may be shipped, but Ihe 
containers in which the conifer 
seedlings are grown are not 
designed for shipping and 
these should be picked up at 
one of three distribution 
points

Planters m a 20-county Pan­
handle area can pick up their 
orders in Amarillo on March 4. 
On March I I .  residents of a 
16-county South Plains area 
can pick up their seedlings in 
Big Spring, and on March 16, 
seedlings will be distributed in 
Lubbiwk to resident applicants 
from the 24 counties sur­
rounding Lubbock

The hardwood species are

good ball game after the long 
Christmas vacation," Riley

Oil Anri Gas 
Discoveries 
Announced

Al'STIN, Tex.. Jan. 6- Rail­
road Commission Chairman 
Jim Nugent announced that 
Texas operators reported 116 
gas and 47 oil discoveries in 
December 1481.

One year ago. 74 gas and 56 
oil discoveries were filed with 
the state's energy regulatory 
agenev

Gas discoveries in the 
twelfth month of Ihe year 
included 24 in the Refugio 
area. 27 in deep South Teias. 
15 in Southeast Texas. I I  in 
West Central Texas, eight in 
East Texas, seven in North 
Texas and the San Angelo 
area, five in the Midland area, 
four in the San Antonio area, 
and three in the Panhandle 
area.

Oil discoveries included 
eight in the San Angelo area, 
seven in North Texas, six in 
Southeast Texas, five in West 
Central Texas, four each in 
East Texas and the San An­
tonio. Refugio and Lubbock 
areas, three in deep South 
Texas and two in the Midland 
area.

In December, operators re­
ported .166 exploratory and 
field tests wound up as dry 
holes. New applications for 
permits to drill oil and gas 
tesls totaled 3.382 in Decem­
ber compared with 3.556 in the 
came period of 1480

Applications to drill, deep­
en. plug back and for service 
cells in December amounted 
to 3.636 against 3.825 a year 
earlier.

McLean Tournament 
Begins Today

Junior high basketball 
teams from five area schools 
will compete this weekend in 
an eight-team tournament at 
the McLean High School gym­
nasium with the first game 
scheduled for 11:30 Thursday 
(today).

Participating in the tourney 
are the Clarendon A teams. 
Clarendon B teams. Claude A 
teams. Claude B teams. Mc­
Lean A teams. McLean B 
teams, Lakeview teams, and 
Hedley teams.

Thursday games will be as 
follows: Clarendon A vs. Mc­
Lean B (girls) 11:30 a m.; 
Clarendon A vs. McLean B 
(boys) 12:45 p.m.; Claude A 
vs. Lakeview. (girls) 2 p.m.; 
Claude A vs. Lakeview (boys) 
3:15 p.m.; Hedley vs. Claude 
B (girls) 4:30 p.m.; Hedley vs. 
Claude B (boys) 5:45 p.m.; 
Clarendon B vs. McLean 
(girls) 7 p.m.; Clarendon B vs. 
McLean A (girls) 8:15 p.m.

Games are scheduled for 
Friday at 11:30 a.m.. 12:45 
p.m., 2 p.m.. 3:15 p.m., 4:30 
p.m.. 5:45 p.m., 7 p.m., and 
8:45 p.m. and Saturday at I 
p.m.. 2:30 p.m., 3:15 p.m., 
5.30 p.m. 7 p.m., and 8:30 
p.m.

CCC Loans To Have 
Lower Interest Rate

WASHINGTON, Jan 5 ~ 
Commodity Credit Corporation 
commodity loans disbursed in 
January will have a 12.25 
percent interest rate, Everett 
Rank, executive vice president 
of the corporation, announced 
today.

The new rate, down from 
14.5 percent, reflects the in­
terest rate charged CCC by the 
U.S. Treasury in January, 
Rank said.

Rank also said that out­
standing 1481-crop CCC loans 
will be adjusted to reduce the 
original 14.5 percent interest 
rate charge to 12.25 percent.

The 12.25 percent interest 
rate applies also to outstand­
ing and new farm storage 
facility loans which are subject 
to the variable interest rate. 
Rank >aid.

Nursing Center Newt

Thomas Nursing Home 
welcomes Beulah Rippy home 
from the hospital.

•••
Sunday, Br Cooper from 

the Pentecostal Holiness 
Church was here to hold 
services.

•••
Monday, we had 17 resi­

dents out for Bingo Many 
thanks to our volunteers. Lena 
Bailev. Ginger Morilla and 
Vela Young.

•••
Tuesday morning 11 resi­

dents attended crafts. Thev 
are making Valentine Heart 
pins to wear, out of beads, not 
only for themselves, but for all 
the residents of the Home. Our 
volunteers were Oleta West­
brook. Marv Lou Garrison and

Linda Syfrett from the Beta 
Sigma Phi In the afternoon we 
celebrated Ethel Meador and 
Frank Solomon's birthdays. 
Our entertainment was fur­
nished by Pauline Miller. Lois 
Myers and her two sons, 
Roger and Steven, Those 
helping serve were Ginger 
Morilla. Evalyn Burch and 
Cecil Fields.

•••
Wednesday, members of 

the Pentecostal Church were 
here for Bible Study and 
returned Thursday for a Sing 
A-Long Also, Thursday, the 
residents resumed making 
their Valentine pins.

•••
Friday. Martha Parker was 

here with her excellent 
movies.

ALANREED BRIEFS
On the sick list last week 

were Betty Finlev. Shirlev 
Armbrister. Jewel Warner and 
Marvin Rawlings.

•••
The Glen Hallums' were in 

Austin during the weekend to 
attend funeral services. They 
returned by the way of Brown- 
wood and visited Mr Hallum's 
mother.

•••
Pat Gray of Amarillo spent 

part of (he holidays here with 
her parents, the P.M. Gib­
sons'.

•••
The Mel Frcnchs' left for 

Vermin this week, where they 
will be for some time.

•••

Marvin Rawlings was re­
leased from Pampa Hospital 
last week.

•••
The Buddy Montgomerys' 

of Lefors were here at her 
sister Pauline's this week.

•••
The Alanreed Community 

Improvement Program met 
Jan. 4 in the school cafetorium 
with the usual covered dish 
supper. Bob Fish then pre­
sided in Glenn Hallum's ab­
sence. Marvin Rawlings was 
elected Vice Chairman as Don 
Horn had moved. Trash pickup 
was discussed as a later 
project. After the business 
session, games of dominoes 
and much visiting was en­
joyed.

BIRTHDAYS
Jan. 15
Bobby Jack Massey 
O N Patterson 
Mrs. Noble Touchstone

Jan. 16
Steven Thacker 

Jan. 17
Virginia Ann Hill 
R.L. Brown 
Billy Jack Bailey

Jan.
Mrs.

18
J.A . Meador

Bill Rodgers 
Mary Evelyn Knutson 
Emmitt Dane Hill 
Jan. 14
Don Alexander 
Pat Vineyard Gray 
Kevin Joe Robinson 
Mrs. Joe Dwyer 
Bryan Hendricks 
Patsy Barker 
Jan. 20
Myrtle Billingsley 
Jan. 21
Terry Lee Vineyard

bare root seedlings. Fewin 
said, and can be shipped by 
normal freight methods

West Texans interested in 
planting trees for homestead 
field, feedlot or wildlife wind 
breaks, should write (or seed­
ling applications: West Trias 
Nursery. Texas Forest Service. 
Rt 3. Box 216. Lubbock. TX 
"*4401. or call (8061 746 5801

Windbreak planters may not 
use these seedlings for land 
scaping or ornamental purp 
uses

Fewin said the seedlings 
would be sold on a first-come 
basis until the end of the 
current planting season, or 
until the supplv is exhausted

the same and the rate is 18 
percent or less- the state gets 
half the interest on tkr m in  
tai portion of the total amount' 
being financed

to the Stvrofoam container. A
minimum order i s 30 priced a* ^ e r C ^ a n | S  S f l 0 U l d  B e  A W 3 T e  Of T SX  C h a H O e
130 per container (plus sal— ”  J v

A U S T IN . T e * . --State  If the interest on the sales 
Comptroller Bob Bullock said lax and the unpaid balance are 
Wednesday that about 1,000 
Texas merchants need to be 
aware of new sales tax re­
quirements on credit sales 
which go into effect January I 

The new law affects mer 
chants who make installment 
sales of taxable items, include 
the amount of sales tax due in 
the outstanding balance and 
keep their books on the 
"cash" basis of accounting 

According to the new law. a 
part of the interest paid on the 
sales tax portion of credit sales 
will be taxable This additional 
amount is to be reported and 
remitted when the regular 
sales tax return is filled

tax). They are sold by the 
container, or in multiples of 
30 The containers are 12 
inches wide by 14 inches long, 
bv 8 inches deep, and several 
containers can be easily trans­
ported in the back seat of a car 
or pickup cab.

The hardwood seedling  
species still available include: 
green ash. honeylocust. bur 
oak. mulberry and Russian 
olive. The hardwoods are sold 
in minimum lots of 100 for $20 
(plus sales tax and shipping 
costs).

The West Texas Nursery 
grows windbreak seedlings for 
a 80-county High Plains and 
Panhandle area, north cd Big 
Spring and west of lfichita  
Falls

If the rate is more than 18 
percent, the slate gets all 
interest on the sales tax 
amount above 4 percent For 
example, a merchant charging 
20 percent interest an credit 
sales will remit I I  percent 
interest on the sales tax 
amount to the state, assuming 
Ihe rate for the sales tax 
portion is the same as for the 
rest of the unpaid balance

comps
All Vegetable Shortening 
Limit I with $7.50 purchase

:risco Shortening 3 lb. can $1.78
Laundry Detergent 84 oz.
Tide Detergent $2.99
Big Tate 16 oz.
Potatoes 79*

Style 1 oz.

G EN ERIC FOODS

Maxwell House Coffee
Coffee $1.9/
I lb. All Grinds 

Van Camp 16 oz.

Pork 'n Beans 3 for $l.uu
Kounty Kist Cut 16 oz.
Green Beans 3 for 89*
White Swan
Hommv

White or Golden

Gallon
Bleacn 6y*

18 oz.

Peanut Butter $1.19
7 oz.

Toothpaste 89*

3 for 891
n 14.5 oz.

Filled
Milk

13 oz.
3 for $1.00

Gladioli Flour 5 lb.
Flour 89*
Kleenex 200 ct.
Tissue 69*

Kleenex Roll
Towels 2 for $1.üu

G'BMJNS M EAT  

Owens Reg . Hot. Mild or Sage
Sausage $1.49 I lb.

2 lb. $2.95
Boneless
Swiss Steak $1,69 lb.
USD A Choice Beef

Cube Steaks $2.49 lb.
USDA Choice Beef
NEW FIRST TIME IN 
M ARKET INDIVIDUAL 
WRAPPED
Kraft Velveeta 12 oz. pkg
Cheese Slices $1.49
Sliced Beef
Uver 69* lb.

Plainsman 2 lb Pkg
Franks $2.99 pack
Weights 3 lb. Box
Bacon $1.99 box
Fresh Frozen Fish Fillets
Fillet of Sole $1.79 lb.

250 ct.
Aspirin 89*

Blackeye Peas 3 for $l.uu
Marina Bathrooi i
Tissue 99'

4 roll pk| 
White Swan
Sugar $1.17
5 lb. Bag 

Sunshine Krispy
Crackers 59*
I lb pkg.

Pillsbury

Cake Mix 77*
Asst. Flavors 18.S oz. 

Sunlight Dish 22 oz.

Detergent 97*

Gebhardt No Beans 14 oz,
Chili 99*

FROZEN FOOD

Carnation 16 oz.
Coffee mate $1.3

Bordens
Nutty Buddy

or Ice Cream 6pk.
Sandwiches 99*

Mr P's
Pizza 79*

Asst Flavors 11.5 oz.
Van De Kamps Light Crisp
Fish Fillet $1.59 14 oz.

DAIRY

Bordens '/j gal.
Buttermilk $1.09

Parkay I lb. qtrs.

Margarine 2 for $1.00
White Swan
Reg or Sweet milk 8 oz.

Biscuits 5 for $1.00

County Fairy Red Spanish 12 oz.

Peanuts 99*
Gibsons I '/i loaf
Bread 2 for $ i.m

Whipped Topping Mix 5 oz.

Dream Whip $|. 19
Schilling Mixes Asst. Flavors

Party Dip 4 for $1.00

PRODUCE

Baking
Potatioes 5 lbs. for $1.00

Yellow

Unions 3 ids. for $i.uu
Yellow Extra Fancy

Squash 39* lb
I lb Bag

Carrots 4 for $l.ut

STORE HOURS 
MON FRI 8-7

Red Delicious 3 lb
Apples /<79*

SHAMROCK, TEXAS
SUN 4 6

4 lbs
Bananas $t.Q(

i
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(C C lflS S IF IE D  ADS sure to get results"))
CLASSIFIED KATE .

SI SO minimum 
10 cents per word 

CARD OF THANKS $2.00

All ads cash, unless customer 
has an established account with 
The McLean News. Deadline 
(or Want Ads - Noon - Tuesday. 
Phone 779-2447.

The McLean News cannot 
verify the financial ootential of 
these advertisements. Readers 
are advised to approach any 
business opportunity’ with 

reasonable caution

FOR SALE: A-frame, three 
bedroom. Furnished or unfur­
nished.

•••
Three bedroom trailer house 
with I '/, baths. 14 s 80 foot, 
furnished or unfurnished.

•••
Small two-bedroom trailer 
house, furnished or unfur­
nished.

CALL DOROTHY 
TON. 779-2674

MIDDLE-

49-tfc

FO U R B ED R O O M , TWO  
baths. Lots of Room. On 
Pampa Highway.

B E A U T I F U L  T H R E E  
bedroom, three bath brick 
home. Large living room ' 
and den. Fenced yard in
good location.

JUST LISTED 2 bedroom 
home with panelled den.

LOVELY BRICK HOME on 
4.75 acres. Three bedroom, 
two bath. Reasonably priced

J I M  A LLISO N  R EA LTY  
Ida Hess Jim  Allison 
779 204! 779-2461
779-2915 . J79-2649

FOR SALE: 1908 i  T 190 Ac 
tractor diesel; 1979 Massey 
Ferguson. Model 126 Square 
baler, wire tie. All equipment 
in good shape. Call 779-2930 

46-tfc

'GOOD COLOR TV for sale.
Mrs Lela Alderson Call 779-
2543.

1
49-tfc

TH R EE BEDROOM HOUSE 
for sale. Call 779-2396 or 779-
2811.

33-tfc

P R O F E S S IO N A L H O U S E
CLEANING done Very hon-
est. dependable, reasonable
rates. 779-2339 256-3755
nights.

50-tfc

EXC ELLEN T HEGARI HAY. 
In stock $2.25. Alanreed- 
779-3174 or 779-3122.

l-2c

ALL T-SHIRTS 20% off one 
special group half price at the 
T-Shirt Shop in The Pot Pourri
Shop.

2-2c

FOR SALE: CH EVY Luv Mik­
ado. 4 cyl. 4 sp , 33.000 miles. 
New paTnt, new seats. gSod 
tires, runs good. Call 
779 2312.

2-2p

FOR SALE: 640 acres good 
grass land. Close to McLean. 
Owner will finance at reason­
able rate of interest. Also 
good 2 bedroom brick house - 
good location, priced at 
$15,000.

BOYD MEADOR REAL
ESTA TE

2-3c.

"Truth, when witty, n the wittiest of all thingi."
Julius Charles Hare

M

"NOW TO BURT THE CRANE AND W E'LI 
HAVE PEOPLE WONDERING FOR AGES!"

Loose Marbles

v t A v s  » r
If I sound a bit depressed to you, Dear Reader, it's because 

ic most important person in my life has left me.
That's right, the love of my life, the person without whom I 

innot live, has told me we're through.
Oh. I'm trying to be brave as I wander through the house, 

axing at the empty rooms.
And I'm trying to convince myself it doesn't matter, that I'll 

st over it eventually, that just because I'm alone now doesn't 
ean I have to fall apart.

But it still is palnM. still hard to admit that things won't be 
e same, that I'll have to go it alone.

Since my beloved hat left me. I will have to face life on my 
vn. will have to deal with the misery of solitude, will have to 
ght the great fight unaided.

I will admit to you. Dear Reader, that although I'm putting 
) a pretty good front, that underneath the smiles and the 
fon t care’s there is a part of me that wants to scream and cry 
id shout. "No! Not No! Please don't leave me! I can't bear to 
I without you!"

I know I know I should never have gives my heart so 
relv I told myself that if I became too dependent I surely 

I be hen. and I was right Here I am. alone and devastated 
•t My housekeeper quit!

FOR RENT: Furnished apart­
ment with or without bills 
paid. 519 W. First

45 tfc

FOR REN T:-3 Bedroom house- 
12 miles south of McLean. Call 
collect . Betty Taylor-(806 
364-4621.) 42 tfc

FOR RENT: 3 BEDROOM  
house-12 miles south of Mc- 
Lean-Call Betty Taylor-806- 
364-4621.

42-c-tfc

LOST AND FOUND

LOST BLUE VEST with car 
keys in pocket. If found, please 
turn in to The McLean News or 
call 779-2579.

2 Ic

HELP WANTED: THOMAS 
Nursing Center, inc. is now 
taking applications for a cook. 
Apply at nursing center.

42-tfc

HELP WANTED: APPLY in 
person at Wil Mart.

46-tfc

I wish to thank the kind 
ladies in the Methodist Sunday 
School classes for calling on 
me at Christinas time and 
bringing me a gift. Your 
kindness meant so much to me 
and brought me the "Christ­
mas Spirit" and made my 
Christmas brighter.

May God bless each of you 
with his richest and many 
blessings.

Mrs. Lucille Cullison

WANTED: 1 LETTER "A "  
from a Pepsi Cola or Mountain 
Dew can. Willing to split 
50-50. Contact Allen Patman 
at 779-2818.

2-Ip

SPECIALS ON FRIDAYS: All 
the fish you can eat for $3.99 
(Includes french fries, cole­
slaw and hush puppies.) L ic L 
Restaurant.

I-tfc

Call Jerry Cook 
at

ATLAS
Plumbing
779-2784

Water-Gas-Sewer

MOBILE HOME FOR SALE in 
McLean. I4ib4. 2 bedrooms. 1 
bath, luxurious woodwork, 
washer and dryer, skirting and 
porch, many extras. Equity 
and assume payments of $255 
at 15% interest. Will also sell 
150 feet of 6 ft. high wood 
fence with two gates, $450. 
Call Donnie at 915-535-2438.

2-tfc

GIGANTIC W HITE SA LE now 
at Potpourri Shop.

2-4c

WANTED: AFTERNOON 
STUDENT help Also full­
time nurses aides. 7 to 3 or 3 to 
II  shift. Apply in person. See 
Cathy Bailey at Thomas Nurs­
ing Center.

2 tfc.

L0WDCR STIAHWAY-
PROFESSIONAL • ‘  

CARPET CLEANING

« r i s i r
Carpel and Upholstery

51

FOR SALE: TWO 302 Ford 
Engines. I with transmission. 
454 Chevy Engine. Headache 
Rack for pickup. Call 779-2064. 
______________________________ 2^ P_

FOR SALE: ALL OCCASION 
decorated cakes. Call 779-2653 
Nettie Bob Roberts, El Paso 
Camp. 2-2d

FOR RINT

FOR RENT: SMALL two bed 
room trailer house, furnished. 
Call 779-2674 or 779-2771.

49-tfc

'ífruJf

•Boots by Tony Lama 
•Guns by Colt, Huger.
Smith A Wesson. Weatherby 
•Hats by Bradford 
•and American 
•Tack
•Western Apparel 

the Whole Family

Complete Line 
Of Quality Brands 

Western Wear

Complete Ranch Outfitters"
Where your Search Ends 
And Hospitality Begins

669 3161 Pampa. Tx

O rig in a l arts &  crafts

T e x a co  products 
a n d

c o n v e n ie n c e  store

¿ " C . . . . .  .

For all your Purina Feeds:

BULK FEED 
BAG FEED

BENTLEYS 
FERTILIZER

301 E. Foster 
McLean. Texas 

779-2209

W il l Do CARPENTER work,
roof'ns painting, ceramic tile, 
acouitii. ceilings. Larry Chris­
topher 179-2206.

48-tfc

TIRLD OF SEWING machine 
problems? See Peggy Dennis 
or Nxncy O'Neal, Bernina 
Sewing Center, 1312 N. Ho- 
ban Pimpa. 665-7147

42-tfc

Open up a whole new world. 
You loo can get first-rate 
television reception. Over 50 
channels via satellite. Superior 
progrxmming. For more infor­
mation or home demonstration 
call 77» m o .

45-tfc

NEED CARPENTER WORK
Done’ Call Leland Myers 779- 
2734

SADDLE AND BOOT 
REPAIR

NEW AND USED  
SADDLES

McLEAN 
SADDLE CO.

I l l  McCarty St. 
McLean, Teias 

779-2339

m a i i l A x.x.a

CONSTRUCTION NOTICE 
From: Wheeler ■ To: 1.0 Miles 
West of McLean on Highway 
No. IH 40. covered by l-ld 40-1 
(117) 141 in Gray County, will 
be received at the State De 
partment of Highways and 
Public Transportation. Austin, 
until 9:00 A M . February 10. 
1982. and then publicly open­
ed and read THIS CON 
TRACT IS SUBJECT OT HTE 
WORK HOURS OF 1962. PL 
87-581 AND IMPLEMENTING  
REGULATIONS 
The state Department of 
Highways and Public Trans­
portation, in accordance with 
the provisions of Title VI of the 
Civil Rights Act of 1964 ( 78 
Stat. 252) and the Regulations 
of the U.S. Department of 
Transportation (15 C .F .R ., 
Part 8), issued pursuant to 
such Act. hereby notifies all 
bidders that it will affirma­

tively insure that the contract 
entered into pursuant to this 
advertisement will be awarded 
to the lowest responsible bid­
der without discrimination on 
the ground of race, color, or 
national origin, and further 
that it will affirmatively insure 
that in any contract entered 
into pursuant to this adver­
tisement. minority business 
enterprises will be afforded 
full opportunity to submit bids 
in response to this invitation 
and will not be discriminated 

t against on the grounds or race
m u v n u m n

color, or national origin in 
consideration for an award. 
Plans and specifications in­
cluding minimum wage rates 
as provided by Law are a- 
vailable at the office of George 
J. Cannon. Resident Engineer. 
Amarillo. Texas and State 
Departments of Highways and 
Public Transportation. Austin. 
Usual rights reserved.

l-2c

MRS ARLEY D. BEN TLEY is 
the new distributor for the 
Amarillo papers. Phone 779-
2569.____________________

MASONIC LODGE 
REGULAR M EETING  

second Thursday, 7:30 p.m. 
Practice nights 

First, Third, and Fourth 
Thursdays at 7:30 p.m.

TERRY’S ELECTRIC 
A APPLIANCES

Whirlpool
AIRM0T0R WINDMILLS &WATLRPUMPS

lu u u m

“ 6
t\aiuu

I

BUSINESS DIRECTORY
BAB

ELECTRIC
Parts 

& Servie«
•ELECTR IC  WORK 

•APPLIANCES 
•TV ANTENNAS 
•HEATING AND 

•AIR CONDITIONING
PHONE 

Loyd Bybee 
779-2601

EM ERGEN CY 779-2517 
2 BLKS NORTH OF I 40 

ON PAMPA HWY 
I WILL APPRECIATE  

YOUR BUSINESS

w

B A R K E R  R E D I - M I X
READY-MIX, CONCRETE

BACK-HOE SERVICE 
AND FINISHING WORK 

PHONE
779-2703 OR 779-2169

L A M B
FLOWER SHOP

7 7 9 - 2 6 1 1
A S K  A B O U T  OUR  

R E G U L A R  F R ID A Y  
SP E CIA LSi i u m u . i i i . . . . .

DON MILLER 
RADIATOR 
SERVICE

“ Is Our Business"
Not a Sideline 

•New k  Rebuilt Radiators 
•Gas Tanks k  Heaters 

Repaired

, SUBSCRIBE TO

~ JÁ e 7 IlLC e a n  /le u # —
IN  C O U N T Y  RA TE J I O  per year 

O U TSID E G R A Y  C O U N T Y i l l  per year 
SPE CIAL 9 M O N T H  STU D EN T R A T E S 7  

You can subscribe by mail by completing the form below 
d mailing with your chert or money order to

TH E M cLEA N  NEW S 
P O  R O X H  

M cLEA N . TX 79057

McLEAN 
HARDWARE 
complot# 

hardware lin#
NAME-

ADDRESS- 

CTTY------ -STA TE-

n fO O D E - i
-OISHES-MINT-
- T O O L S O lP T f -

779-2591

GLENN HALLUM 
BACKHOE SERVICE

Commercial or Individual 
Fully Insured

Alanreed, eyas

779-3138

Tany Lama, Taxa» 'H

Aetna, Justin
laatftar Oaad« 
Ihaa »«pair

p h o n e  7 7 9 - 2 1 6 1

Foshee’s 
Texaco

Your full service dation 
Earned k  Maurine Foshee 

Owner*
779-2621

W E N O W  H A N D LE

AMWAY
PR O D U CT S

9 « 9 a f  r  y  f
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If  Employer Does Not Deduct Sociol Security, You Still Must Pay
In most jobs, the social 

»eturity tat 1» taken from 
your payment automatically. 
But on some jobs, you shouid 
ask to be sure your pay ia 
reported for soctai security 

If you work in someone’s 
home-cooking, cleaning, doing 
yard work, or some other 
)ob-your cash wages count for 
social security if you earn $50 
or more from one person in a 
3-month calendar quarter Be 
sure the person you work for 
has your social security num­
ber and reports your pay.

Man» employers will offer to 
pay only cash (no checks) and 
make no deductions from your 
pay This is to the employer's 
advantage because he or she 
does not wish to pay the 
employer's share of social 
security taxes. It is unfair to 
the employee because the 
employee does not get credit 
for his earnings which earn 
quarters of coseragc for social 
security protection

It is important to remember 
that the exact amount of social 
security benefits you and your 
family would get depends on 
how much you earn If your

earnings are not reported, you 
would get less social security 
or might not be insured with 
less than enough quarters of 
coverage.

Some places of business will 
offer to let vou work for them

DATES
January IS ■ 7 p m. 

Lisestock Judging. Court­
house Annex.

AMARILLO STOCK SHOW 
Thirteen Gray County 4 H 

members are preparing for the 
Amarillo Slock Show. January 
1*4-23 The show will begin 
with barrows weighing in at S 
p. m.. January Id and conclude 
with the junior Livestock Auc­
tion Sale at d:30 a.m.. January 
23

Barrows and lambs will be 
judged in the Ret Batter 
Building on the Tri-State Fair 
grounds in Amarillo. Barrows 
will be judged beginning at 5 
p m January 20 and at 8 a m 
January 21 Lamb judging will 
begin at noon January 21. 
Steers will be ludged in the

on a self-employed basis If 
your work is supervised by the 
employer, you are an em­
ployee of the business, not 
self-employed. The employer 
must withhold social security

coliseum beginning at *4 a m 
January 22.

Gray County 4-H members 
planning to attend the show 
include Christs George. Julia 
Graham. Ross Hinton. Robin 
Rohde. Sabrina Parker. Kerri 
Cross. Preston Cross. Tammy 
Greene. Mindy Homines. 
Sheila Romines. Tres Hess. 
Jimmy McPherson, and De 
Ann Ingrum

TO PO 'TEXAS JUNIOR 
LIVESTOCK SHOW 
The Top O' Texas Junior 

Livestock Show will be held at 
the Clyde Camith Lisestock 
Pavillion in Pampa March 
IJ  17

Gras Counts 4 H members

taxes from your pay and he 
must match vour taxes w«h 
held by the same amouat 
Self-employed individuals 
must pay all their own social 
security at a higher rate.

4-H CORNER
can obtain entry forms from 
(he Gray County Extension 
Office Entry fees are $10.00 
for each steer and $7.00 for 
each barrow or lamb.

CA REER EXPLORATION 
A 4 H Career Exploration

|  If you work for someone in 
their home or at a business 
place, be sure your employer 
has your social security num­
ber and reports your pay.

If you need further infor­
mation or assistance, please

project will be beginning soon. 
You will have the opportunity 
to identify your abilities, think 
about your life goals, collect 
information about careers that 
meet sour requirements and 
make a tentative career choice

contact us at 125 S. Gillespie. 
Pampa. Texas. Call toll-free 
1-800-J*42-I603 for any Social 
Security information or toll 
free I 800 442 2620 for Medi 
care information and help with 
medicare claims.

and develop some plans for 
achieving your chosen field of 
work If you would be interest­
ed in attending the project 
meetings, or have any ques­
tions. contact the County Ex­
tension Office at 664-742*4,

Bill Hobby Will Run For Reelection As Lieutenant Governor
AUSTIN Lieutenant 

Governor Bill Hobby today 
took the final step in formaliz 
ing his candidacy for re- 
election by filing with the State 
Democratic Executive Com 
nuttee in Austin. Hobby, who 
has served as Lieutenant Gov-

ernor for the past nine vears. 
expressed hit renewal of his 
committment to do everything 
in his power to better the lot of 
all Texans and help give them 
an effective and responsible 
state government Hobby said. 
"Ms goals for 1*482 and be­
yond are to give priority to

increasing the excellence of 
education for our school child­
ren and college students; im­
proving law enforcement and 
the criminal justice system; 
and. continuing to maintain a 
balanced budget for state gov­
ernment without new taxes."

"Don't part with your illusions Whvn they are 9 one you may still exist, but you have 
ceased to Inte." Mark Twain

assft
EVERYTHING GOES I 
COST AND BELOW I

ladies A childrens 
ready-to-wear

TOWN & COUNTRY 
FASHION SHOP

EAST SIDE OF SQUARE
WELLINGTON TEXAS m -447-W S

Hi l l DING ALSO FOR S A U  m  F Ave. ^

Gold Medal

FLOUR
5 lb. bag

95‘
QUICK LUNCH INGREDIENTS

SAVE! SAVE! SAVE! 
WITH GENER 1C FOODS

16ozcan DelMonte Whole

NEW POTATOES 2 - 8 *
Mile High 16 oz can

TOMATOES 2 * s1
Shurfine 16 oz can

FRUIT COCKTAIL 2 - M
Recipe Sauce lb 1/2 oz can

SLOPPY JOE SAUCE 59<
Campbells

CHICKEN NOODLE SOUP 3 - *1
Shurtine

TOMATO SOUP 4 - M
Armours 12ozcan

TREE! S1B
Thrift King Cut lb 1 /2 oz. can

GREEN BEANS 4 - *1

Family Size

CHEER
171 oz box

S6» TV

Generic I gallon

BLEACH 69<
Generic 32 oz jar

CATSUP 15-
Generic Golden 16ozcan

CORN 3 - >1
Generic 2b lb. bag

DRY D06 FOOD *2«
Generic

MACARONI & CHEESE DINNERS
7 oz pkg

4 * $1
Generic large roll

PAPER TOWELS 2 - *1
Generic Sliced 16 oz can

PEACHES 2 - 93“
Generic 32 oz jar

SALAD DRESSIN6 If
Generic 4 roll pack

TOILET TISSUE 65‘
King Size

CRISCO
3 lb. can

$2«

BREAKFAST ITEMS

Shurfine Unsweetened 46 oz can0RAN6E JUICE if
Shurfine Unsweetened 46 oz can

6RAPEFRUII JUICE If
Welchs 2 lb jar

GRAPE JELLY *1*
Maryland Club 1 lb. can

COFFEE >1"
Kraft Parkay 1 lb. qtrs.

MARGARINE 59<
FROZEN F00DS=

JOY
32 oz

Shurfine 8 oz ctn

WHIPPED T0PPIN6 59*
Shurfine Frozen

KRINKLE CUT 
POTATOES

2 lb bag

Shurfine Frozen 14oz box

DONUTS 8 *
------ SPECIAL-SPECIAL-

12 oz can six pack

COKES *1»
PRODUCE--------- --

MEAT

California Navel

0RAN6ES 39
Specials Good

Jan. ¡4 -Jan. 16, 

1982

Wl A il VOUB 
TO» ITAM»

■ IDCMmOM CIMTM

GRAPEFRUIT 6->l
WHITE POTATOES » • ‘*¡'1"

bunch _

GREEN ONIONS 2 - 49
bunch

RADISHES 2 - 4 9

°”*n‘ SAUSAGEj . . !]» 2 -  - s3"
Owens CHILI >1" *

v iso n s  ( ¡ ¿ c o n  2  «  «  % jn

G etter, Q Q

I
t

, .<* « a# •• « • *»»«*> *•* •4fc * % %
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