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A  Town Mee. 
been set for Friday . 
at 7 p m at the McLean 
High School auditorium 
to discuss the possibility 
of re opening the McLean 
Hospital, according to 
George Terry, mayor of

McLean The meeting 
was set following a dis 
cussion with a prospec 
five doctor Monday af 
ternoon at the City Hall 

Mayor Terry, several 
councilman, and about 25 
townspeople, along with 
Gray County Commlss

loner Ted Simmons met 
with the doctor from Kan 
sas and George Griffith 
who is a hospital admin 
istrator

Following the discus 
sion, Terry said that the 
group decided to call the 
Town Meeting to find out 
how the townspeople feel

about reopening the hos 
pital "W e  will have to 
reobtain a Certificate of 
Need, and we will have to 
decide how we can raise 
funds to re open the fa 
cillty ," Terry said

The doctor who visited 
Monday asked that his

narne not be publicized 
since h* is still under 
contract at another fa 
Cility However, he said 
th.n his cousin and his 
cousin s wife were both 
d<* tors and would be 
Interested in establishing 
«  practice with him He

and his cousin plan to 
visit McLean Saturday 
following the town meet 
mg to continue discus 
sions with the City 

Terry said that Gray 
County officials and Me 
Lean City officials will 
attend the Town Meeting 
Friday night to answer

questions from 
people in the area 

At the meeting Mon 
day afternoon, the group 
discussed the possibility 
of establishing a hospital 
district in the south part 
of Gray County Sim 
mons told the group that

a hospital district can 
only be created by the 
state legislature and then 
aproved by a vote of the 
people in the area He 
said that the legislature 
would not meet again for 
two years, so a hospital 
district was not an Im­
mediate solution
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Reunion D ra w  
Crowds In  Y e a rs

I'HIS C O W B O Y  IS about to lose his seat during the 
Friday night session of the bareback broncs at the

McLean 66 Roundup Rodeo For more photos of 
the rodeo and reunion, see page 5 ¡Photo by Linda 
Hoynesl

The 1983 edition of 
the McLean 66 Rodeo and 
Roundup was an unqual 
ified success, according 
to Roping Club officials, 
sponsors of the event 
“ We cleared enough on 
the gate to pay for the 
stock," Gwen Henley, 
secretary, said "W e 're  
delighted with the good

__crowds each night "
The club received 

$2700 on gate receipts for 
the two nights of perfect 
weather “ It’s the best 
rodeo, with the biggest 
crowds, that I've seen in 
15 years," Jake Hess II 
said “ I can remember a 
time when we actually 
considered doing away 
with the rodeo, but this 
year's success will keep 

a^ u s  going "
Winners in the various 

events were as follows 
BAR F B A C K  R ID IN G  

first Bobby Adcock of 
W O P  Canadian. 69. second 

3  Marty C nm  of Amarillo. 
U | jS  67. and Justin Fuires of 

Canadian and Mike Wint. 
of Mangum tied for third, 
with 62

j F  BULLS first, rocky 
Lowery of Amarillo. 62. 
second Carl Ivey of Ham 
mon, Okla . 61. and third

Kevin Holt of Canyon. 
55

SA D D LE BRONCS 
first. Sam Bittsof Adrian. 
60 and second, Lynn 
Guthrie of V ici Okla . 51 

D O G G IN G  Kelly 
Flowers of Canadian. 
5 60. second. Jim New 
som of Wheeler. 5 90. 
and third Kent Hall of 
Canyon. 6 19 

C A LF ROPING first 
Sid Howard of Canyon.
9 94 second C R Wes 
ley of Wayside. 10 46 
third Jerry Light of Ama 
rillo, 10 64 and fourth 
Mike Goad of Brisco.
10 88

BARRELS first. Kelly 
Freeman of White Deer, 
17 56 Lone Maynes of 
Guymon. Okla . 17 72, 
third Kristy Johnston of 
Channmg. 17 82, and 
fourth Shalia Drake of 
Woodward Okla 17 83

S TE E H  R IDIN G  first 
Colby Brown of Amarillo, 
51. and second Destry 
Magee of McLean, 41 

S T IC K  HO RSE R A CE 
first. Heather Hess of 
McLean

T E A M  RO PING (Sun­
day afternoon. 210
teams)

1 Danny Garcia and 
Rusty Tooley. 2 Bruce 
Potter and Ramon Ma 
zee 3 Jackie Breeze and 
Bryan Potter. 4 Van 
Barnes and Mike Goad; 
5 Rob Lauer and Buster 
Record. 6 Lindon Mor 
row and Bryan Potter. 7 
Jackie Breeze and Frank 
Bridwell; and 8 Roger 
Chorkly and Bill Drake 

The Roping Club also 
presented a buckle to 
Mona Lou Finley for her 
continued support and 
participation in the Me 
Lean Rodeo

Council Passes Resolution
All members of the 

McLean City Council 
were present at the regu 
tar meeting June 14 for a 
lengthy session The 
only official action the 
council took was to give 
the Housing Authority a

Who says life in a 
small town is dull?

Last weekend in Me 
Lean, there were so many 
activities that we needed 

1 a schedule to arrange our 
time

Oldtimers tell me they 
don't ever remember a 
carnival as such in Me 

j Lean before (Or does 
Martha Jo Bailey really 
qualify as an old timer?) 
M artha  said she re 
membered a circus here 
years ago. but never a 
carnival

Th e  m idw ay was 
bright, attractive, with 

j good crowds every night 
H o p e fu lly , the group 
made enough money that 
they will make McLean 

i an annual stop 
#«#

From almost anyway 
you look at it, the week 
end of festivities in M c ­
Lean was a success 
Every event, from the 
cutting horse contest to 
the horse race to the 
parade to the barbecue 
was well attended June 
Suggs tells me that 221 
exes registered during 
the reunion, and that 331 
barbecue tickets were 
sold

The fact that we had 
perfect weather for a 
change contributed to the 
success of the activities 
Perhaps the McLean Ro­
deo has outlived its rain 
Jins of the last few years 
The sunny weather made 
all the activities more 

fun

from  the 
d ista ff side

by Linda Haynes

I think the parade was 
the best that I have seen 
in McLean in the last 15 
years Many of the 
townspeople went to the 
extra trouble to prepare 
entries for the event, and 
we received lots of out 
of town support for the 
parade

Special thanks have to 
go to George Terry  and J 
Boyd Smith for organiz­
ing the parade

And speaking of people 
whe* worked hard Gwen 
Henley, each year, does 
an absolutely fabulous 
job of keeping the com­
plicated books for the ro­
deo Her jobs begins 
early and ends late (after 
the performance and af­
ter the after performance 
ropings) If you've never 
tried to keep up with that 
much money, and keep 
all those times and scores 
straight, and pay off im­
patient cowboys, and col-
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County Commissioners Accept Airport Bid
Julia Clark 

The Pampa News 
Th e  C o m m issioner's 

Court of Gray County ac 
cepted the $51.200 bid 
submitted by Lewis Con 
struction C om pany of 
Pampa for runway re­
pairs at Perry Lefors Air 
port at a regular meeting 
Wednesday 

The $51.200 bid by 
Lewis Construction Co 
was awarded, pending 
approval by the Texas 
Aeronautics Commission 
of the $6,820 increase in 
the estimated cost of the 
project

In M ay the T A C  ap 
proved a grant of $37,500 
to Gray County, based on 
the original estimate of 
$50.000 to seal coat the 
main runways and ad)a 
cent areas At Wednes 
day's meeting the court 
decided It had enough 
money to accept the 
$51,200 bid. plus 10 per 
cent for the consulting 
e n gin e e r's  fees, plus 
$500 for a contingency 
fund, for a total project 
cost of $56.820 

The court will submit 
the new figure to T A C  for 
ipproval If the T A C  
tpproves the new cost, 
he state through the 
TAC. will share the cost 

of the project on a 75 per 
cent • 25 percent basis, 
with the state picking up 
75 percent or $42.615 
($5.115 more than the 
original grant)

The court decided to 
review the 11 bids for 
construction of a county 
agricultural building In 
McLean It will

vene Friday at 10 a m to 
award the bid The bids 
ranged from a low of 
$38,975 submitted by G 
& H Steel Building in 
Claude to a high of 
$56.157 subm itted by 
Heavy Duty Steel Build 
ing of Pampa The 5.000 
square foot multipurpose 
building will be used by

the McLean community 
for F F A  and 4 H  shows 
and other community ac 
tivities

An amendment to the 
budget to pay Texas 
Mental Health and Men 
tal Retardation for con 
tract services was ap 
proved The county will 
Pay M H M R  $10.900 a

year for an employee for 
the Pampa Satellite Cen 
ter

In other business the 
court adopted a court or 
der and resolution for a 
cooperative em ergency 
management plant In 
explaining the need for 
the court order and reso 
lution. Steve Vaughn, e

m ergency management 
coordinater which has al­
ways existed in between 
the cities of Lefors. Me 
Lean and Pampa and 
Gray County If all the 
entities approve the plan 
and organization, the 
area would become eli­
gible for federal funds 
should a major disaster
S t r ik e

waiver for the ad valorem
tax for one year only, to 
pay the current bills, and 
to pass a resolution to 
borrow money to pay for 
the seal coating of the 
city streets

The council spent the 
rest of the time discus­
sing several job applica 
tions, and discussing 
other business

Attending were coun 
cilmen Loyd Bybee Bill 
Thomas, W  A  Bentley,

and Jim  Barker mayor 
George Terry and city 
employees Bob Glenn, 
Chester Bohlar. and 
Stella Lee

Lubbock Man Charged In Hit-AncURunAccident
Benito Galarza. 24, 

of Lubbock was charged 
on June 8 with failure to 
stop and render aid The 
charges stemmed from a 
hit and run accident in 
volving the Rev Billy 
Wilson, pastor of First 
United Methodist Church

in McLean, who was in 
jured in the accident June 
1 In Lubbock 

According to the Lub 
bock Police report. Ga 
larza was northbound on 
Avenue Q  In a 1965 
Chevrolet when he ran a 
fed light and struck Wil

son who was walking east 
across the avenue Gal 
arza allegedly left the 
scene and proceeded 
north on Q  to Fourth 
Street

As of June 15 Galarza 

had not been arrested.

although bond had been 
recommended at $2.000 

Wilson, who was taken 
to Methodist Hospital in

Lubbock, was admitted 
as a patient and spent 
eight days in the hospital

He suffered an abrasion 
to the scalp, cervical 
strain, hematoma to the

right thigh, and a pos 
stblc concussion in the 
accident He returned to 
McLean June 9

Ben Coma Wins Annual Ranch Horse Race
The largest crowd In 

the history of the event, 
gathered Saturday after 
noon north of McLean to 
watch the annual running

of the McLean Ranch 
Horse Race Some ob 
servers estim ated the 
crowd at well over a 1.000 
people who gathered a

long the stretch of grass 
track to watch 14 horses 
from local ranches run 
440 yards

Winner of the race

was Ramon Ben Coma, 
riding a horse from the 
Brass RO Ranch Second 
place went to Joe De 
Leon, riding a horse from

the H aynes Tria n g le  
Ranch, and third place 
went to Trip  Townsend, 
riding a horse from the 
Franklin Ranch

fine, the roce was 

almost K> close to eoli Pictured on the loft I» 
Ramon B*n Coma. mho mon the race On the right

Is Joe DeLeon mho was second (Photo by Linda 
Haynes]
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Sen. S a rp a liu s ’ DW I Legislation Signed In to  Law  By G overnor M a rk  W hite
(Austin) Texas 

tough new driving while 
intoxicated legislation, 
sponsored by Senator Bill 
Sarpahus. was signed in

to law today by Governor 
Mark White According
to Senator Sarpalius.

The new law represents 
a significant step toward

reducing the number of 
drunken drivers on Texas 
roads and highways "

In its final form, the 
measure toughens fines

and sentences for those 
convicted of driving while 
intoxicated, the new law 
eliminates deferred ad­
judication and it includes

G O V E R N O R  M A S K  W H IT E  p re se ts the pen he
used to sign the D W I  legislation to Senator Bill

Sarpahus the author of the legislation (Photo 
Courtesy of Senator Sarpahus office ]

a new state definition of
intoxication

(.»ovemor White signed 
the bill saying. “ Senator 
Sarpalius deserves an e 
normous amount of credit 
for the passage of this 
law It's one which I'm  
sure everyone will be 
proud of

State Representative
Terrall Smith, who spon 
sored Sarpalius' bill In 
the House said. " I 'v e  
never before seen a Sen 
ator who was willing to 
work as hard on a bill as 
Senator Sarpalius did on 
the DWI Legislation "

Senator Sarpalius says.
‘ ‘Our goal is to save lives 
We heard many cries 
from families who had 
lost loved ones as a result 
of drunk drivers This 
law was spurred by those 
outcries, and I'm  proud 
the legislature stood to 
gether and passed a bill 
which will act as a de 
terrent to driving while 
intoxicated "

Under the new law. a 
first time offender will 
face a maximum punish 
me'-it of two years in jail 
and a $2000 fine A

Residents’ Granddaughter Attends Senior Hiqh Workshop first time offender can
* receive probation without

Val Mane Gordin 
granddaughter of Wanda 
and Arnold Sharp of Me 
lean, spent the week of 
June 4 through 11 at 
Northwestern Oklahoma 
State University in Alva 
Ok la attending a work 
shop for senior high 
school music students 
The  show choir/chor 
eography clinic taught 
students to combine 
dance movements with 
vocal music to enhance a 
stage show The week 
ended with a program 
given by the students on 
Fridav night for parents 
and friends to demon 
strate what each had 
learned

Miss Gordin, daughter
of Gary and Peggy Got 
din will be a junior at 
Dumas High School She 
was recently presented 
with an award for having 
a straight A average for 
the 1*182 83 school year 
The high school art de 
partment also presented 
a special award to Miss 
Gordin for an original art 
design She signs alto as 
a member of the Dumas 
High School choir and 
studies voice privately

Last summer both she 
and her mother toured 
Europe and sang with 
the Texas Am erican
Youth band and chorus

F D R  
An Intimate H istory" 

by Nathan Miller 
In this the only one 

volum e com plete bi 
nqrpahv of FDR in print 
Nathan Miller looks at 
the man whose remark 
able talents and bril 
liant personality helped 
change the United States 
more than any other pres 
¡dent

From his youth at Hyde 
Park Groton, and Har 
vard to his political edu 
cation supervised by 
Louise Howe as Assis 
tant Secretary of the 
Navy to his governorship 
ot New York (which was 
but a carefully planned 
step on the road to the 
W hite House) and the 
dizzying madness of the 
W32 convention. Miller 
charts the forging of 

Roosevelt s political and 
personal character if

M

She will be appearing 
June 23. 24 2S with the 
Dumas Little Theatre in 
Neil S im on's "P la za  
Place”

Miss Gordin is the

LIBRARY 
N O TE S

8  Sm

indeed the two can he 
separated For despite 
the hurdles thrown in his 
path defeat when he ran 
tor vice president in 
1420 disabling polio, the 
near wreck of his mar 
riage to Eleanor, he 
proved himself unfailing 
ly quick and discerning in 
marshalling his awesome 
charm and pragmatism to 
achieve his goals The 
excitement of the New 
Deal one of the few 
successful gradualist rev

grand niece of M r and 
Mrs Leroy Blaylock and 
Jack and Relia Ayers 
Great great aunt is Sa 
ironia Pettit

oultions in H istory", is 
explained as is FD R 's 
controversial handling of 
the Second War W ar As 
this fascinating bi 
nqraphy demonstrated, 
h istory and Roosevelt 
conspire to create, if not 
always a hero, always a 
man

You will certainly en)oy 
FD R  An Intimate His

tory and it is now a 
vailoble at Lovett Mem 
onal Library

going to jail by partici 
paling in an alcohol or 
drug dependency evalua 
tion and completing the 
other necessary condi 
lions of probation 

Jail time will be man 
da tory for repeat offer 
ders Second time of 
fenders will face jail time 
of from IS days to two 
years and a fine of $300 to 
$2000 On a second D W I 
conviction a person will 
have to serve at least 
three days in jail as a 
condition of probation 

A third time offender 
will lace from 30 days to 
two years in the county 
jail or from 60 days to five 
yean in the Texas De 
pr ment of Corrections 
ard a fine of from $S00 to 
12000 On a third con

viction, a person will 
have to serve at least ten 
days as a condition of 
probation

Penalties will be fur 
ther enhanced in D W I 
rases involving death or 
serious injury Under the 
new law, a drunken driv­
er who injures another 
person in an accident will 
receive a minimum of 30 
days in jail, even it he 
receives probation for the 
rest of the sentence

Killing someone while 
driving drunk carries the 
same two to ten yeat 
penalty the offense now 
carries But. the new law 
would require that such 
defendants spend at least 
four months in prison, 
even if they are granted 
probation

Juveniles who are ar 
rested for drunken driv­
ing will face the same 
penalties defined cur­
rently by the juvenile 
court However under 
the new law. a first time 
Juvenile offender must 
take the D W I educational 
course to avoid manda 
tory license suspension 
After a second D W I con 
viction. a juvenile will 
lose his or her license for 
a year or until he or sh$, 
reaches the legal drink­
ing age whichever is 
longer

The new law also in­
cludes a new state def 
inition of intoxication 
Under the new law. a 
person would be legally 
drunk if a test for alcohol 
in the blood showed a 
concentration of 0 10 per­
cent or more Previously, 
the blood alcohol level 
was considered only 
‘ evidence" of intoxic* 
tion Studies show that 
people with a 0 10 per­
cent blood alcohol level 
are too drunk to be 
d riv in g ." according to 
Senator Sarpalius

The new law also elim­
inates deferred adjudica-
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From Page 1
lect from hundreds of 
contestants, and concen 
trate for hours at a time 
to make sure no errors 
have been made then 
you can't fully appreciate 
her job

E v e r y b o d y  sh o u ld  
really brag on Gwen and 
tell her what a good job 
she s doing each year 
After all. what if she 
should get tired of that 
mess, and one of us gets 
stuck with that nasty 
job’ ??

Dale and Rose Steel 

also had a big respon 
sibility this year in o r­
ganising the rodeo and 
keeping all the entries 
straight In fact, many, 
many people worked hard 
to make the weekend a 
fun. memorable occasion 
for all those who at 
tended

I had a wondarfu! time 
How about you’

Cancer Society To Offer Free Program
The American Can 

cer Society will offer a 
free education program 
for cancer patients and 
family members

A  volunteer team con 
sisting of an Oncologist, a 
medical social worker a 

registered nurse, and a

nutritionist will present 
the information in the 
program Subjects in­
cluding Learning About 
Your Disease. Daily 
Health Problems. Nutri­
tion and Expressing Your 
Feelings will be covered 

The program will be

held June 28 from 7 to 10 
p m  at the Coronado 
Community Hospital in 
Pampa

Th » Bahamas
2300 rach y iW ti
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tion for any D W I often 
der. meaning that any 
person convicted of 
drunken driving will be 
unable to have the of 
tense removed from his 
or her record after com 
pleting probation 

The new law provides 
tougher penalties which 
are designed to eric our 
age repeat offenders to 
seek treatment for alco 
hoi problems Those wil 
ling to enter alcohol 
treatment programs will 
face more lenient jail 
terms than those who re­
fuse The new law re­
quires the director of a 
treatment facility to noti­
fy the court should the

person not make a good 
faith effort to participate 
in treatment The new 
law also allows the court 
to order the defendant to 
pay for all or part of the 
cost of such a rehabilita 
tion program 

"Th e  new law Is de 
signed to keep the repeat 
D W I offender off the 
street and get him or her 
into an alcohol treatment 
program We realize that 
Just locking up drunk 
drivers won't accomplish 
very m uch," Senator 
Sarpalius says 

Senator Sarpalius be­
lieves the new law is one 
Texas can be proud of 
The law goes into effect 
January 1. 1984

Scientists tay that out in the galaxy th-re art until »tan. 
about tha sue of th t Earth — and made of diamond
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I hope Wimbledon shows some clout, 
And will deal with McEnroe's pout;
If the demeanor's bad,
From the pompous young cad; • 
They'll then kick the bloody bloke o u t!»

— — — J
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with Mrs Cecil Nicholas* 
were her grandchildren, 
Bill and Kristina Moh 
renweiser from Colorado
Springs. Colo 

• • •

Lavern Brooks has re 
turned from a trip to 

Lynchburg, South Caro 
lina She and Bill and 
Cindy Wilson, Billy, 
Keny, and Angie visited 
Bill's parents. M r and 
M rs Colt Wilson in 
Lynchburg They also 
visited points of interest 
in South Carolina and
North Carolina 

• • •

Ted and Jean Longino 
have been to Sapulpa. 
Ok la , for the 40th wed­
ding anniversary of M r 
and M rs Charles Wat 
kins.

• • •

Ruth Magee has re 
turned from a trip to 
Europe

• • •

Anna Jean Lamb. Rob 
bin Skinner and Stefanie 
Houdyshell are a part of 
the group of young 
people from the Pampa 
area who will spend four 
weeks in Europe Spon 
sor for the group. Ameri 
can Institute for Foreign 
Study, is Leta Olsen of 
Pampa

• • •

M rs A  E  Carpenter 
was surprised with a 
birthday party Monday 
afternoon at Thomas

McLean Briefs
Nursing Center Cookies 
and ice cream were 
served by ladies from the 
Heald Methodist Church
and other friends 

• • •

W ill and Rachel Hens- 
lee of Dimmitt spent sev 
eral days with their 
grandparents. Bill and 
Katy Graham, while their 
mother. Cathy, was at­
tending a nursing semi­
nar in Ruidoso, N M  
Mark Henslee spent the 
weekend with the 
Grahams and returned 
his children home on 
Sunday • • •

Matthew and Kristen 
Bell of Pampa spent the 
weekend with their 
grandparents. R C  and
Martha Parker 

• • •

The United Methodist 
Women recognised the 
fathers in the church 
during the morning ser 
vice John Holland was 
presented a plaque for 
being the father of the 
youngest child present at 
the service John C. 
Haynes was presented 
the Patriarch plaque for 
having the most descen 
dents (12) at the service. 
Sam Haynes and brother, 
Johnny Haynes tied for 
having the child who had 
travelled the farthest to 
be present for the Fath 
er's Day service All the 
men present were pre

LOOSF.cMARBLES
by Lun Patman

N E W S  S T O R Y  F R O M  B IS M A R C K . N  O  ■ Ed  
Bickle. a 71-year-old retired farmer from Tutt'e. N  D  . 
teas taking a morning stroll recently when he found a 
wallet lying in a ditch

Bickle said. " I  walked by and turned around and 
picked it up It had S I.320 There were 13 S1Q0 bills "

The wallet belonged to Arthur Pykles. a retired
policeman who had lost it during a hunting trip in the 
fall of 1981

When Bickle phoned Pykles with the news that the 
wallet had been found, Pykles told him to keep 1500 os 
a reward and to send him the wallet along with the rest 
of the money

Septigenarian Bickle
Found the wallet of officer Pyckles 

In the purse of the fuzz 
Bickle found that there was

Enough money his fancy to tickle

Thirteen hundred and change was in there.
Enough money to raise every hair 

On poor Bickle's head.
And to keep him well fed.

And assure life in an easy chair

But honesty was Bickle's lord.
So he returned the policeman's hoard

And the cop was quite happy.
If a little bit sappy 

He gave Bickle five hundred reward

W hile this story is not such a crisis.
A  question in my mind arises 

Now I'd  like to know 
About that bunch of dough.

And I'll bet that the answer surprises

Please tell me how a retired dick'll 
Amass such a wad. is he fickle7 

I don't know the reply.
But I'll bet by and by 

That the officer's wife pickles Pykles!

sented with a bookmark 
with the poem, “ Foot 
prints" on it

M l

Nine children were 
registered for the Library 
Story Time on Tuesday 
morning All children 
ages four and five are In 
vited to attend from 10:30 
to 1100 every Tuesday 
morning

• • •
Visiting the W  C . 

Kennedy» over the week­
end were the Kenneth 
Simpsons from Hobbs, 
N M ., the Edward Simp­
sons from Sherman, and 
Ricky Kennedy from  
Miami

• • •
V isitin g  the Sam 

Hayneses last weekend 
were Sally Haynes and 
Pam Johnston, M r. 
and Mrs Ricky Evans, 
Chris and Jackie, all of 
Lubbock

Joy Rhine, bride- 
elect of Gary Cogburn, 
was honored with a bridal 
shower Sunday afternoon 
at the home of M r and 
M rs Sam Haynes

The serving table was 
laid with white damask, 

centered with a 17 
branch brass candelabra 
which held pink candles 
and was entwined with 
pink silk roses. The 
white cake was decorated 
with pink roses, and pink 
chocolate bells were 
served along with pink 
fruit punch

Hostesses for the 
shower were Jeanette 
Kennedy. Lisa Patman, 
K athy C a ite r. Jeane 
Smith. Virginia Holwick, 
Jan Johnson. Jacque Ri­
ley. Sally Haynes. Evelyn 
Hunt. Jill Terry. Martha 
Parker. Elaine Pierce, 
Monta Jean Smitherman 
and Linda Haynes

History Wall 
Dedication Set

The latest addition to 
the White Deer Land 
Museum in Pampa is a 
History Wall, which has 
just been completed A  
dedication program will 
be conducted at the mu 
seum. 116 S Cuyler 
Street in Pampa Saturday 
at 2 p m

The wall presents a 
comparative hisotry of 
events which have occur 
red in Gray County, the 
United States, and the 
world Historians work 
ing on the project were 
Jo A n n  Jo nes, Jane 
Steele, and the museum 
staff The artist was Jan 
Ragsdale, and the com 
mentator was W illiam J  
Ragsdale

The public is invited to 
attend

Some people say it is un 
lucky to enter a house or 
room with the left foot 
foremost.

Mmmmmmmmmm

COWBOY
DRIVE INN

109 hi Cedar McLean. Texas 7791315

M ore than 2.200 
students at Texas Tech 
University qualified for 
the deans' honor rolls in 
the university's six col­
leges during the 1963 
spring semester. Sally 
Haynes, daughter of Sam 
and Linda Haynes of M c­
Lean was included on the 
roll

To  qualify for a dean's 
honor roll, a student must 
have a grade point av­
erage of 3.5 or more on a 
4 0 scale and must have 
taken 12 hours or more of 
classes

Athlete Signed 
To Scholarship

David W oods of 
Rockdale, son of M r and 
Mrs Benny W oods 
*>gned a full athletic 
xholarshtp recently with 
Blinn Junior College 

Coach Waldo Dalchau. 
who made the trip to 
Rockdale to sign the 6-5 
post, was injured during 
his stay in the town when 
» chain saw he was using 
to cut wood snapped back 
into his face The injury 
required about 140 
stitches to repair the low 
er part of his face

Descendants 
For Family

The descendants of 
Rosa Smith met June 19 
for the Smith Reunion 
Attending were Olene 
Dinga. Rita W ell, and 
Gary Dinga. all of A m a ­
rillo. Bertha Smith and 
Susie Trout of McLean; 
Joe W . “ B u d " Johnston 
of Houston, Edith Bybee 
of McLean. Bill Kelly of 
Riverside. Calif ; Rosie. 
Don. Cindy and Tommy 
Don Smith of Beaver, 
Okla , Jesse “ Chock1' 
and Birtie Smith of Me 
Lean. James Sylvia, and
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Of Rosa Smith Gather 
Reunionln McLean June 19

Brian Smith of Amarillo; 
Letha Bybee Kelly of 
McLean. Ricky Johnston 
of Houston. Leone Tatum 
Johnston of A m a rillo . 
Opal Johnston Craig of 
Amarillo. Vada Matthews 
of McLean, Bill. Billie. 
Jeff and Amber Kingston 
of McLean, Jim . Shirley, 
and Sharon Williams of 
Midland. Edward and 
Tillas Smith of Glendale. 
Ariz . Donna R Courtney 
of B o rge r, D oris N . 
Isaacs. Marie L Court 
ney, Christy R Courtney,

B e v e r l y  S t e g a l l ,  
Michelle, Melissa, and 
Mikel, J r  , Frankie and 
Patttc Preston. Misty, 
Kelly and Shree of Bor 
ger, Gary, Kathy and 
Kevin Turner of Ama 
rtllo. Bill and Ansel Lit 
trail of Lelia Lake. Pate 
and Mayvon Smith of 
A m a r i l l o ;  T h e r e s a ,  
Trisha and Jared Brittain 
of Amarillo. Ricky. Vtr 
ginia and Patricia Littrell 
of Lelia Lake, and Dood 
and Rush Turner of Me 
Lean

Four Generations Of The Barker Family Meet To Celebrate Father’s Day
Four generations of 

the Barker family last 
weekend held their first 
reunion In several years 
The get together was in 
memory of M r and Mrs 
Bert Barker who came to 
McLean from Sayre. Ok 
la in 1937

The reunion was June 
19. Father's Day. at the 
home of M r and Mrs 
James Barker Three 
fathers were honored 
with engraved wall 
plaques with their names 
and *1 Love You. Dad' 
from their children 
Honored were Roy Bar

ker. Shannon Barker, and 
James Barker.

An old fashioned cook 
out was enjoyed, with 
baked ham and all the 
trimmings, and food 
brought by each member 
of the family

Roy Barker was pre 
sented a birthday cake in 
honor of his 80th birth 
day

Attending from out of 
town were M r and Mrs 
John Bible. Kane and 
Jason from Colleyville. 
Mr and M rs Rodney 
Barker. Pam and Am y of 
Shamrock. M r and Mrs

Robert Barker. Shanna, 
Wade, and Judge, of 
Pampa, Jeff Gage of 
Pampa. Sheri Jones of 
Pampa. Mrs Sherell 
Ponder of Dumas. M r 
and M rs Ralph Littrell of 
Shamrock, and M r and

M rs Danny Rice, Eric 
and Aaron of Borger 

Those attending from 
McLean were M r and 
M rs James Barker. M r

and Mrs Jim  Barker, 
Patsy and Jamie. M r and 

^Mrs Roy Barker. Mrs 
Rebecca Stubbs. Scott

and Le Erin. Nadine 
Webb. M r and M rs. 
Shannon Barker. M r and

M rs Cas Barker. Dale. 
Michael and Jennifer. 
M r and M rs Ora Wayne
R*rker a-vt Adam

Donations Needed For Repair 
Of Rodeo Ground Scales

scales at the rodeo 
grounds will donate to 
help cover this cost. 
Sherrod said

Anyone who wishes to

donate to help pay the 
$680 should contact

The scales at the
McLean Rodeo grounds

north of McLean have 
been serviced and tested.

and the bill is $680, ac­
cording to Bob Sherrod

“ W e hope that those 
ranchers who use the

either Sherrod or Ted 
Simmons

Food Bank Will TakeL ivestock Donations
T h e  H ig h  Plains 

Food Bank will help pro 
ducers process meat from 
unm arketable livestock 
and distribute it to needy 
people, according to Bill

Graham of M cLein He 
said that producers can 
donate any animal thev 
can't market (crippled, 
underweight, etc ) The 
food bank will process the

meat and issue all donors 
a receipt for the full mar 
ket value of the meat 
saved from the animal 
The donation can be used 
for a tax deduction, 
Graham said

If anyone wishes to 
learn more about the 
program, he should con­
tact the High Plains Food

Bank. Box 31803, Ama 
rtllo. Texas. 79120. or call 
(806) 374-8562. or call Bill 
Graham in McLean

Thomas Nursing 
Center welcomes a new 
resident. Dalphia Car
penter of McLean 

• • •

Earl Tolleson is in the 
High Plains Baptist ho» 
pltal in Amarillo, we wish
him a speedy recovery 

• • •

Sunday. Brother
Archie Cooper of the 
Pentecostal church was
here to conduct services 

• • •

Monday residents
playing Bingo were Alma 
Fandal. Inez Fields. Earl 
Tolleson, Lona Jones. 
Kittle Hessey. Bill Shaf 
fer. Willie Williams. An 
nie Eudey. Leon Burch 
A  L Welch. Buck Hen 
ley. Ruth Kem p and 
Ruby Bidwell Our help

NURSING CEN TER  NEW S
ers were Mildred Giesler. 
Ona Gibson. Juanita
Smith and Bertha Smith 

• • •

Wednesday members 
of the Pentecostal church 
were here for a Bible 
Study and returned 
Thursday for a Sing A - 
Long

• • •

Friday our residents 
making flowers for our 
float were Alma Fandal, 
Drucie D w yer. Inez 
Fields and Lona Jones A 
special thank you to 
Deanna Sprinkles and 
Sissy Barker also for 
working several hours 
making flowers for us In 
the afternoon M artha 
Parker was here to show 
her movies

S a tu rd a y  a fte rn o o n  
was Parade time Rest 
dents riding on the float 
were Alma Fandal. Ruby 
Cook. Leon Burch. P L 
Ledgerwood and Hazel 
Mackie along with Tina 
Th o m a s. Eve lyn  P e n ­
nington and Betty Lopez 
Residents attending the 
parade were Buck Hen 
ley Maggie Morris. Lona 
Jones and Lula Sheegog

Our "Fam ily N ignt" 
Bar B Que will be this 
coming Friday at 6 p m 
All family and friends of 
residents are invited to 
attend Please bring a 
covered dish and serving 
utensil Meat is pro­
vided Gib Welch and his 
"Lone Star Band'' from 
Borger will be here to en­
tertain us

r \
t r p ttr i/  M r  A t nsw/ f /  p rw t  

a /  M s  n u t testy* r /  A t t i  4ÉMM4/ r t
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a r e  r /  '  V r  » m i  f e m r j  M /ntt.

r At/nttAny. M s /term/y  /t/M  f /  fn n t 

a /  J f * v  / ( / n A  t e  M r  n/9t r n s tn  

M iti/  fie/k/t U  Y'ÀeeA
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WHEN
THINGS

GET
TOUGH,

CUTTING DOWN 
ON YOUR

ADVERTISING BUDGET
ISA

GOOD WAY OUT• • • •

of business

CAU US AT

Serriag UtUm m i At Ara» h a  HM

779-2447
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McLEAN HIGH  SCHOOL REUNION

M E M B E R S  O F  T H E  clast of 1917 who met 
Saturday afternoon were, from the left Beatrice

Anderson Foster Frank le Upham White, and Lush
Royers (Photo by Linda Haynes]

FIVE O F  T H E  original 10 members of the M H S  
class of 1923 came to the reunion Saturday 
Pictured are. on the back row from the left. John C

Haynes. Ercy Cubine. and Lyman Ashby On the 
front row are I net Shaw Fields and Ted Glass 
|Photo by Linda Haynes)

‘ i !

» .
I *

I v

• t 

‘ »

M E M B E R S  O F  T H E  class of 1925 who met 
Saturday were Barbara Wmdom Hambnght. Essie

Worley Howard. Thelma Gatlin Hopkins. Gladys 
Holloway Smith, and Verna Rice Burris ¡Photo by 
Linda Haynes]

1 >*•>-

F E R N  B O Y D  A N D  Mary . .nderson Eustace were 
the only members of the class of 1924 who came to 
the reunion Saturday (Photo bv Linda Haynes]

CLASS M EETIN G S
The McLean High 

School classes of ¡923. 
24 . 25 and 1917 met at 
the home of Mr* Fern 
Upham Boyd Saturday 
afternoon Thoee attend 
ing were Luah Rogers of 
Me Loan. Frankie Upham 
W hite of Pampa Beatrice

Footer of M cLean. Lorena 
Ashby Brown of Waco. J  
Kent Ashby of Celine. 
Sheila Foster of Grand 
Prairie, Mary Anderson 
Eustace of Clyde. Inez 
Shaw Fields. John C  
Haynes. Barbara Ham 
b rig h t. G ladys S m ith ,

Essie Howaro. Thelma 
Hopkins. Verna Burris. 
Im ogene G lass. Te d  
Glass. Helen Black. Sue 
C u b in e . E rc y  C u b in e , 
and Fern Boyd, all of 
McLean. Maurlna and 
Lyman Ashby of Lub 
bock

M r and Mrs Ber 
nard McClellan hosted 
the meeting last Saturday 
afternoon for the classes 
of 1943. 1944 1945 

Those attending were 
Loyce (Thacker) Sherrod, 
Colleen (Burrows) Mer 
tel. Carl A  Dwyer. Frank 
Simpson and M r and 
Mrs Dickie Everett (El 
fie Lou Carpenter) all of 
McLean). Troy Isom of 
Ontario. California. Bill 
Carpenter of Divide. Col 
orado M r and Mrs Joe 
Turner (Eulema Lively) of 
Amarillo. James Reneau 
of Shamrock M r and 
Mrs Kenneth Davis 
(Betty Lou Roth) of 
Fritch. Shirley (Glass) 
Hostadt of Denver. Colo 
rado. M r and Mrs Frank 
Stewart of Lubbock. Nova 
Lee (Beesigner) Pardue 
of Grand Prairie. M r and 
Mrs Joe D  Pegram of 
Cincinnati, Ohio. Jess 
Ledbetter and daughter 
of Spearman. M r and 
Mrs Thclter McPherson 
(Georgia Lee Barrow) of 
Halium City, Texas. Mrs 
Gayle Montgomery of A 
bemathy. Mrs Tasso

Attending a reunion 
of the McLean High 
School classes of 1927. 
28 and 29 at the home of 
M r and Mrs S A 
Cousins Saturday were 
Gladys Smith of McLean 
Johnnie Rodgers of Ama 
rtllo. Laeuna Caldwell of 
Amarillo Joelene Van 
noy of New York. Carmen 
Mitchell of Michigan. Lu 
cilia Gething of Amarillo 
John B and Winifrec 
Rice. Dorothy Patterson 
Lloyd Hunt. Elton anc 
Maggie Ruth Johnson 
Mary Powell. Francis

Kennedy. S A  and Isa 
bel Cousins, all of Me 
Lean, and C  0  anc 
Eunice Dennis of Mid 

City

M t M B E R S O F  M H S  classes of 1927. 1928. and 
1929 gathered at the home of M r and Mrs S A  
Cousins Saturday afternoon Shown from the left 
are Winifred Rice. Johnnie Villa Rodgers. Dorothy 
Patterson. S A  Cousins. Laeuna Caldwell, Lucille

CLASS M EETIN GS

Gething. Isabel! Cousins. Joellene Vannoy. Mary 
Powell. Francis Kennedy. Lorena Ashby Brown, 
M r and Mrs C  O  Dennis. Carmen Ulm  (teacher], 
Elton Johnston. John B Rice, and Lloyd Hunt. 
¡Photo by Linda Haynes)

Pugh (Freddie Glen 
Johnson) of Odessa. Mr 
and M rs Norman W im

berly (Nadine Boyd) of 
Waller. Texas. M r and 
Mrs W  J  Hanner of

Baird, M r and M rs J  
Keith (Melba Jean H an­
ner) of Amarillo, Mrs

Cora Mac (Blocker) Jo r­
dan of Amarillo, and 
Robbie Corbin of Groom

c

A broken air 
conditioneri 
can be the 
best thing thatever

happened 
to your 

household 
budget.

Your air conditioner breaks down You hav. several choices Repair Replace Buy a whole 
new system All major investments Southwestern Public Service Company sugqeets that 
you consider a more efficient alternative

Consider the electric add on heat pump The add on heat pump is a very special air condi 
I toner that works with your present furnace Besides cooling your home in the summer, it 
helps heat your home in the winter

The add on heat pump is one of the moat efficient ways to heat and coo) Call us to see what 
your livings can be

SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE COMPANY
«0*1

-V  uf

4
.3*
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RODEO

K E L L Y  M O O R E  R O U N D  the second barrel during 
the barrel race at the McLean 66 Roundup Rodeo
Friday night [Photo by Linda Haynet]

IN  T H E  C U T T IN G  Horte Contest Friday afternoon, 
last year 's winner Butch Turpen lets his hone work 
the calf away from the herd |Photo by Linda 
H aynet)

HORSE RACE

C U TTIN G  HORSE C O N TE S T
5 Jun* 23, 1983 T H E  M cLE A N  N E W S

T H E  C O W B O Y  M A R K E D  his horse coming out of 
the stalls during the first night of the bareback 
bronc riding event at the McLean 66 Rodeo 
Roundup [Photo by Linda Haynes)

RAMON BEN C O M A , riding a hone from the 
Brass RO ranch, came In first In tfw McLean Ranch 
H o n e  Race Saturday afternoon [Photo by Undo
Haynes)

T H E  R O P E R  S W IN G S his loop to catch the calf In 
•hort order during the Friday night calf roping 
event at the McLean 66 Roundup Rodeo [Photo by 
Linda Haynes)

> V ^ h W I  V I  >  -  S

JO E  D E  LEO N  won second place In the ranch hone 
roce Saturday afternoon [Photo by Undo  Haynet)

* v  • »



r

T H E  M cLE A N  N E W S  Ju n « 23. 1983 Pag« 6

LOCKSMITH

Call 669-6332 * ' as—
For Appointment m

A. SEEL LOCKSMITH L*k 6 Saft Werk

-AM 4 4S¿AV«

'•# «Mba
J-«S CuUlN 

PAMPA ff IAS ’«Übe

BUSINESS 
DIRECTORY

PHOTOGRAPHY

N 7  k u  h u r J  < / \ o l o f r a p l * U i

t
•Specializing in weddings and portraiture 
•Photographic equipment and accessories

Co'O'iaoc SnopP'ng Cent«
R D  ine Sut.v » ’jine'se 2-C-K
(8C* 6E>‘ ’ 6ÛC P*Tipíi Te» 7906-

FURNITURE

fiJu * *
I  u r n  i t m n

E
e

■

E

BEAUTY SUPPLIES

W E HAVE M OVED!
l O M K  B Y  A N D  V I S I T  U S  
V T O l  R N E W  L O C A T IO N

222 N. C U Y L E R
Koitm iK NfcitK’ht Fâ hwifu*»

TWO B S BEAUTY SUPPLY
M* iul\ inti ll.it U i Sunti*- 

\ApMele-'wtl* tml Kc< ul

! KM N Banks 
PAMPA TEXAS 79065 

40b bbS b50b 
Th« Company To Have 

In Your Home

DRY CLEANING 

Expert
DRY CLEANERS

MICHELLE'S FASHIONS
® Thu L iU*m Fishioiis And

\nrwsii(Y Itrm*
Sir .i.irm*"

I A*«- Roy Knit*
Sun»n**r Smualrrx

«©

MICHELLE S BEAUTY 
SALON

N i n i l K  |RMASTlHA\ I'AMI'A

i i u m m m m M M m m M i m M M w m w n t ?

TRAVEL AGENCY

One
Hour

Martinizing
Bring your cleaning when 
you shop in Pampa 
Pick it up the same day'''

* 4

Itf jc /

DINAH H O W AR D
Ommm M— d%w

Our Services Are F ree
80GAÎ65 2J94

. J ¿ * ; . \ . Á k L i u : l i u m .  i k m T ì U u  r m u ï i

CLASSIFIED ADS
CLASSIFIED  R A T E  '  

$2 00 minimum 
IS cents per word 

CARD O F T H A N K S  13 
All ads cash, unless 

customer has an estab 
lished account with The 
McLean News Deadline 
for W ant A ds Noon 
Tuesday. Phone
779 2447

The M cLean News 
cannot verify the ftnan 
nal potential of these ad 
vert iw men ts Readers
are advised to approach 
any “ business opportun 
ity w ith reasonable 
caution

H AYH AU UN O

HAY H A U L IN G  • Call 
Jay Dee Fish at 779 3160 

25 2c

HAY H A U l 7n g 7  256 
2857, Shamrock. Texas. 
Ronnie Bailey

23 12c

C U S T O M  C U T T I N G  
HAY Bailing 826 3483 

24 8c

J& M  C O N TR A C TO R S  
Handyman Service • 
Home Repairs Shingling 
is a specialty Free es 
timate Call 848 2893 or 
883 4082

21 tfc

B& R G A R A G E  
Open Under New 

Management 
117 W  Railroad 

F R E E
Front Wheel Bearings 

Packed W ith Every 
Brake Job

RIAL 1ST A TI 
lOR » A i l

FO R  S A LE  T O  be moved 
two room. 1 bath house at 
4th and Wheeler Call 
779 2643

19 tfc

tUSINISS

NEED A M W A Y 9 
Call

Amway Distributor 
Alme Winegeart 

779 2795
15 14c

Three bedroom, one 
bath house newly re 
m odeled. 320 N 
Wheeler

111 I 40

3 4 bedroom  home 
close to school 2 full 
baths 714 N Rowe

E x c e l1 l* lo c o tio n , 
doul '4 ^  •] «rage,
storm cenai ii/ ,5 0 0

P V D IA U C C D
O A W S S  aSO R tt 779 J64I 
•Ol N MAIN McLIAN. TIXAS

f
C i -I JT£ U  ^
W W ®  h i

MEN’S WEAR

i /

Two locations to serve

1807 N Hobart 
1824 W Francis 

Pampa Texas

J

OFFICE SUPPLIES

P a m p a  O r n e e  S u m  y C o
'»A H • » »* **# ’ •

i% l#»r '«**•'

I« . M'*» Ft*. *

HOBBIES* CRAFTS

GRAHAM
FVRNITVRE

Free Delivery Credit Terms

BM-nm
u n  K M

y w»läf ami Lupitalitf
lo w  1 itivdo Hradqvarlrn

220 N. CUYLER PAMPA, TEXAS 

(806)665-4561

LAMPS

1415 N Hobard
665 2232

Pampa

E g i t t o  a i d  Ç igltta

Casablanca Ceiling Fans. 
Lampa Lampshades 

Lighting Fixtures. Gift 
Items. Lamp parts 
Bulbs, and Clocks

107 N Carter 
Piim/ni Tree. 70061

WESTERN WEAR

The Hobby Shop
o r  r«M K A  in c  

'Custom ready made frames 
crafts • needlework • ribbons

VÿÀYNES \yfeSTERN V^EAR

Everyth!*•„ _ r the Cowboy, Coi 

a ¿ow hone J
Khofm tl u# « « «  e is i

I I ¿ f *W' M a n u i  
«MW* r u a i  f o o t

..AVNE STRIBLING 
•earns

I M  M. HO® ART 
RAMPA. TEXAS 7WM

call
779-2447

to put your
business

in this guide.

COSMETICS
MONOGRAMS

GIFTS

For the best in children s 
wear children s shoes 
nursery and children s 

i furniture

las pampas 

galleries

h P u n n a  $ ^ A i o u o y ’i a n i

i ih m m A i  i  — it* .  r . M y .  i • H u a i  • tamii m i  u h i

«  biay A «l M i lN V l

Lw Uvm  — Huoi.^iuaiMiay

IsntHtimeyou 
met (he other woman?

Let us introduce you to the beautiful you at

m E R LE n o w n u n  c o s m n i c s

Coronado Center
666 5952

u T «r  m n  k* « « « and «m m «

< & Z u / L  G A r m a

W M a iOuQOoM t

J IM  ALLISO N  
R E A L T Y  

Farms. Ranches.
Residential. 

Commercial. Oil 
and Gas

T W O  nice two bed 
room Good Locations

239 Acres 106 acres 
cropland 133 acres 
lovegrass cross 
fenced, priced to sell

640 Acres with excel 
lent Land Im prove 
ments 331 Acres of 
Love grass in 10 pas 
tures and 309 Acres 
Native Grass in 2 pas 
tures Partial financ 
ing available

779 2461 
779 2649

w n z m r a n ia u n m m

FO B  SA LE 4 bedroom.
2 bath home $20.000 or 
best reasonable offer 
Call 779 2638

22 tfc

FO R SA LE 10 lots, close 
to school 817 N Wal 
dron Call 779-2678 after 
5:30 p m

22 tfc

m i A t L

TUTORING

W ILL D O  T U T O R IN G  In 
En g lish  and reading, 
grades 1 through 8. and 
math, grades 1 through 
5 Janet Glass, 779- 
2158

25 2c

VIHICLIS, BOATS 
A ACCKSSORIES 

FOR SALE

1982 TR A N S  A M  FOR 
Sale - still under warranty 

7.000 miles, excellent 
condition Call Leann 
Webster at 779 2828

22 4p

FOR SALE 2 21" Color 
T V 's  • $125 and $150 
Also 2 19" Color T V 's  - 
$150 and $200 Almost 
new golf bag pull cart 
$15 Williams Appll-
AnCPR

M O V IN G . M U S T  SELL 
'59 Chrysler runs good, 
new upholstery, needs 
battery and starter

Sears Kenmore 30'' gas 
range with timer and 
light. $150 or best offer 
1 butcher block formica 
top dinette table with 4 
chairs. $50. 1 dinette 
table with no chairs. $10 

Set of old 

golf clubs $50 Call Cecil 
or Marsha Reynolds at 
779 2538

ROPES. LA R G E SHIP 
M E N T  just arrived N y­
lon and Polyester All 
different lays McLean 
SaddleCo 111 McCarty 

25 2c
, FO R S A LE 1 Evapor 

ative 2800 B TU  A ir con 
dition and 1 refrigerated 
air conditioner. 18.000 
B T U  Call Cecil Back at 
779 2069

P A R TY  G O O D S ■ We 
now have a good selec 
tion of Hallmark Party 
goods Check with us for 
your bridge tallies, nap 
kins and other paper 
goods We have table 
goods W e have papier 
ta b le c lo th e s , p la te s , 
cups, napkins for July 
4th festivities. Th e  
Potpourri

FOR S A LE  1982 Ford 1 
ton - 11.000 miles 3- 
year-old Lincoln Arc W el­
der and Truck Bed 1974 
Pinto - new transmission 

work car or kids car 
719 M cCarty. 779 2373 

2S3p

IT 'S  B A C K  T O  BASICS • 
We are now carrying 
Curity Cloth Diapers - 
$16 75 per doz The Pot 
pourri

MATERNITY 
WEAR advertise here

4

at our best rates

SALVAGE

U flQ Q tf iiS

NATIONAL
AUTO

SALVAGE

666 3222 or 666 3962 
1W miles west of Pampa 

on Highway 60 '  
Large selection of 

used auto part»
We appratiate 
your business
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sure to get results In The Kitchen
*  U n *  Henna.
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M O f t I L I  H O M I S  

F O B  » A i t

14 x 80’ Mobile Home • 
Carpet & Drapes. Wash 
er and dryer connections 

$7,000 Call 779 2538 

25 tic

YARD SAL I

Y A R D  S A LE  610 N. 
Kingsley Saturday only, 
from 10 a m til?????

25 Ip

ANIMALS 
FOR SALS

FOR S A LE  W E A N E D  
hampshire pigs 
Male or female 779
2538

N o n c i s

M A S O N IC  LO D G E  
R E G U LA R  M E E T IN G  

second Thursday. 
7:30 p m 

Practice nights 
First, Third  and Fourth 
Thursdays at 7:30 p m

HILR
W A N T I D

T H O M A S  N U R S I N u  
C E N TE R  is now accept 
Ing applications for 
Nurses Aids • all Shifts 
Contact the Director of 
Nursing in person

33-tfc

C A R P  O f  T H A N K S

We want to give a 
great big thank you to 
those who helped moke 
the parade a success We 
appreciate your support 

George Terry and 
Jay Boyd Smith

W O K  W A N T I D  T o  0 U *

W O R K  W A N T E D  JA C K  
Syfrett 779 2577

17 tfc

FOR RENT

H O USES -O R  S A LE or 
rent 779 2629

10 tfc

T O  G IV E  A W A Y : 10 

month old female calico 
cat Has been spayed 
and has all shots Call 
779 2601

T O  G IV E  A W A Y  female 
German shepherd puppy 
779 2601 or 779 2139

25 lp

Have a Picnic 
Shopping for 

Bargains 
in the

ANT ADS
D IS TR IB U TO R S  N E E D  
E D  FOR Meadow Fresh 
Dairy Products in this 
area Ground floor op 
portunity! Contact Sandy 

. or Edwin East. 1036 
Crane Rd , Pampa. (806)
665 5231 after 5

18 8p

Your 
Business 
Should Be 

Here 
Call

779-2447 
ECT

A t a recent church 
youth meeting, the spon 
sors served something 
they called a "P ile -up” .
I was impressed by the 
ease of preparation, the 
gusto with which the 
teenagers consumed the 
dish, and the inexpen 
sive, but delicious quality 
of the food If you arc 
feeding a crowd, increase 
the proportions of the 
dish The recipe is de­
signed to serve about 10 
to 12 This can be served 
fa m ily -sty le  or buffet 
style.

Com  Chip Toco*
2 x/t lbs ground beef
1 large onion, chopped
2 tsp chili powder

2 tsp dried whole or
eqano

2 tsp ground cumin 
2 tsp salt 
Y« cup sugar 
Y* tsp garlic powder 
2 (8 oz ) cans tomato 

sauce

T (6 oz.) cans tomato 
paste

4 cups water
1 (10 o z ) pkg corn

chips

2 green peppers
chopped

1 avocado, chopped 
1 small head iceberg 

lettuce shredded
3 tomatoes, chopped

1 cup sliced ripe or 
pimento stuffed olives

2 cups (8 oz ) shredded 
Cheddar cheese

taco or picantc sauce 
Cook beef and 1 large 

cnlon in a Dutch oven

until meat is browned 
Drain Add next 9 in 
gredients. simmer 1 hour 
over low heat, stirring 
occasionally 

Arrange cornchips on 
serving plates Spoon

Quotable Quotes
In free countries, 

every man is entitled to 
express his opinions -  
and every other man is 
entitled not to listen

G  Norman Collie 
The ship of heaven 

guides itself and will not 
accept a wooden rudder 

Ralph Waldo Emerson 
I honestly believe it is 

better to know nothing

than to know what ain't 
so

Josh Billings 
It is better to wear out 

than to rust out
Richard Cumberland 

I would rather sit on a 
pumpkin and have it all to 
myself than be on a 
crowded velvet cushion 

Henry David Thoreau 
The superior man un-

meat mixture over chips 
Layer with onion, green 
pepper, avocado, lettuce, 
tomato, and olives Top 
with cheese Serve with 
taco or picante sauce

derstands what is right, 
the inferior man under 
stands what will sell

Confucious 
Nothing more detest 

able does the earth pro 
duce than an ungrateful 
man

Ausonius 
Blessed is the influe 

cen of one true, loving 
human soul on another 

George Eliot

—3C3KÆÏ2U — BU
BUSINESS CARDS 

(Ms iH 'jfean  /le u Li

HAIR STYLING GASOLINE
DlANN D ALTO N S

Country Cut
B E A U TY  SHOP

Open 
Tuesday 
through 
Friday

and Saturday 
until noon ( f .

Men s and w __ it
Women s * S L-

r v
Hair styling

I miles south 
of McLean
on F M J I4 J

779-2413

21MÊUU1CIÔL WORK
Don't sweat out the summer 
Have your air conditioner 
repaired by Loyd By bee

BAB ELECTRIC

Parts A Service 
PHONE

779-2601
Emergency 779 2517 
2 blocks north of I 40 
on Pampa Highway 

I appreciate your business

Foshee'sTexaco
Earnest & Maurine

Eoshee 779 2621

ÍtexacSÍ
201 W Railroad

AUTOMOTIVE

$ > ..............
Don Miller
Radiator
Service

Is Our Business 
•Not a Sideline 
¡•New & Rebuilt Radiators 

•Gas Tanks & Heaters I; 
•Repaired 

612 S Jefferson 
AMARILLO. TEXAS

can help you design 
business card 

that is just right 
for your business.

Call Linda 
or Kathy 
At 779-2447

PLUMBING
BILI SPIOM BINO 

77*» 2515 
716 W  1st

Specializing in add ons 
And Remodeling 

And Repiping 
McLean

Bill Robinson Owner

GASOLINE
DALI S

SERVICE S TA TIO N

217 W 1st 
Me leal.
779 21 HI

779-2447 779-2447

REGISTERED CATTLE

V
me,- neo ••*»« iongo» .  i v m  

D enwor-h Line Camp

Now Selling 
8 reg heifers 
12 16 months old 

Reasonable

JOHN M ANO JOYCf MAYNfS
murrsxm'

errons nxm *o> n
w.iAs -uw

: '!) \ 
\ l\ I

%
376-6666

BACKHOE SERVICE

Glenn Hallum 
Backhoe Service 

Commercial or Individual 
Fully Insured 

Alanreed, Texas 
779-3138

INSURANCE
Germania 

Farm Mutual 
Insurance 

Don Wilson
779-3174

WESTERN
WEAR

Johnnie 
F. Mertel 
Boot Shop

shoe repair 
114 N Mam

779-2161

Bug Baggers 
Pest Control

<1

$
V

V

Complete 
Pest Control 

State 
Licensed 
Serving 
McLean 

For 8 years 
Call Collect 

655 0090 
Canyon. Tx

655-0090

FEED, FERTILIZER 
For all your PURINA Feeds:

BULK FEED 
BAGFEED

BENTLEYS FERTILIZER
J O I E  Fonar 
McLean. Teta»
779 009

Prices range 
from moderate 

to expensive

STATIONERY

~tM $7IlijCean J le u ft- 
is youi*

headquarters 
for the finest 
in stationery 

Engraved 
Embossed 

Printed

ADVERTISE 
HERE 

AT OUR 
BEST RATES

Call K athy 
O r Linda 

At 779-2447

RUBBER
STAMPS

HARDWARE

McLean
Hardware

779 2591 
1 IS N Mam 

McLean

WATER WELL 
SERVICE

W A TER  WELL 
SERVICE

Submersible Pump Sales

8,
Service

DAVID BROWN 
806.779 2678 

Box 273

McLean. TX 
79057

806/779 2678

Prices range 
from $3 up.

CARPENTRY

Carpentry, Room Additions 
Panelling - Cabinets 

Painting Finishing
Stucco Masonry
Plumbing- E lectrical 
JAMES L  CRONE

No )ob too small or
loo large

779-2988 McLean

ROOFING
Roofing

and
Roofing Repairs 
Free Estimates 
Experienced!!! 
Tommye Cole

779-3177

MAGNETIC SIGNS

— d u ifjs ^ r u w t—
is distributor 

lor
j w y o l j  m a g n e t ic  s ig n s

Let us help you design 
•magnetic signs 

•posters
•bum per stickers 

decals
•real estate signs 
for your business 
or organization

fast service • reasonable prices

PkiNTING

The McLean News 
will print statements, tickets, 

advertising flyers 
envelopes 

any business form  
Call us at 779-2447

PLUMBING

Call Jerry Cook 

at

ATLAS
PLUMBING

779 2784

CONCRETE WORK 

BARKER REDI MIX 
Ready Mix, Concrete 

Back-Hoe Service 
And finishing work 

PHONE
779-2703 or 779-2869

FLOWERS

Ask about

Friday specials

779-2611
low N Mam

McLean

■ +  00 *rn La f -I .t Jp. 1 '+*** <



T H E  V F W  F L O A T  won third place In the McLean 
66 Rodeo Parade Saturday afternoon John Gibson 
was Uncle Sam. and Brandy Melton was the Statue 
of Liberty [Photo by Linda Hayn«s|

Mrs. Thomas Dies June 15
G c o r g ia n n e  G 

Thomas 35. of Amarillo 
di«d June 15 in Amarillo 

Funeral services were 
Friday in Suburban Bible 
Church of Amarillo 

Mrs Thomas was born 
in Oklahoma City and 
moved to Amarillo from 
Pampa in 1977 She was 
a member of Suburban 
Bible Church She mar 
rled Buddy Thomas J r  in 
1973 in Pampa 

Survivors include her

husband a son. Clayt 
Thomas of Amarillo a 
daughter. Lacy A nn 
Thomas of Amarillo, her 
mother. M rs Mary Gil 
lian of Atlanta. Ga . a 
brother Joe Grayson of 
Pampa a sister Chris 
Patton of El Jobe I. Colo . 
and her grandmother 
Kafheryn Grayson of Ok 
lahoma City 

She was the daughter 
in law of M r and Mrs 
Dorman Thomas of Me 
Lean

Lei a Local Agent Help
Handle Your Claims:

0
HospHaBzation-Cancw 

Medicar* Suppkmints-Burial

CALL 779-2790

Jerry Corbin

WHEAT GROWERS

WARRI 
ELEVATORS

IN
Wellington. Texas would like to 

handle your wheat W e have 
excellent facilites and an efficient staff 
to get trucks unloaded and back to the 

field O ur office staff can prepare 
warehouse receipts for wheat 

stored at Wellington which is going 
into the loan program We i 

continually working with the area 
ASCS offices to give you the best 
possible service on government 

programs affecting your grain We 
have one of the best cash wheat 

markets m the area and are looking 
forward to doing business with you 
Warrick Elevator Wellington. Tx 

806/447 2404
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Floats, Clowns, Riding Clubs........ They All Came To The Annual McLean 66 Rodeo Parade Saturday Afternoon

you can get 
whatever you want 
at heritage ford

You’ll Look Good In 
One Of The Beautiful 

New Fords, Or One Of Our 
Shiny Tough Pickups, Or 
One Of Our Sleek, New 

Roomy Vans!

Come In And 
See Them 

At

Come In A nd See 
Our Vans and R. V.s! t M

Ftrlliacifc-llercvy

701 W. Brown

“ Where Pride and Service Pampa, Texas
Make the Difference" 665-8404

A S K  U S . . .
about the things you auto ' know!

R A M O N  B E N  C O M A  won second in the Individual 
category in the McLean 66 Rodeo Parade for his 
horse and pock mule [Photo by Undo Haynes)

T H E  P A N H A N D L E  
C L O W N S  from  K I X Z  
kept their vehicle "u p  in 
the a ir" during the Me 
Lean 66 Rodeo Parade 
Saturday afternoon  
|Photo by Linda Haynes)

TH IS  F L O A T  F R O M  the Thomas Nursing Center 
won first place in the category for floats at the 
McLean 66 Rodeo Parade Shown are from left.

Haie Machie Tina Thomas. Leon Burch. Pinky 
Ledgerwood Betty Lopes. Ruby Cook Alm a  
Fondali and Evelyn Pennington (Photo by Linda

McLean 66 Rodeo parade (Photo by Linda
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DOW N M EM ORY LANE
Compiled By Som Haynes From The File* Of The McLean Newt

10 Y E A R S  A G O  
E M  Bailey. Ed

Rev Robert Brown has 
been appointed pastor of 
the First United Meth 

I odist Church and the 
Heald Church for a fourth 
year. It was recently an 
nounced at the closing 
session of the annual 
Northwest Texas Confer 
ence in Abilene 

t t t
One hundred twenty 

two ex student and seven 
ex teachers of McLean 
High School visited the 
area museum during the 
homecoming weekend. 
June 8th and 9th 

t t t
On Sunday Emmett 

Thompson and family ot 
Quanah visited his sister 
M rs Willie Boyett Vis 
iting with her this week is 
her sister. Mrs Maude 
Prefontainc of Ada, Ok 
lahoma
20 YEA R S  A G O  
Jack Shelton. Ed.

Young Pat Windom 
was the only McLeanite 
to reach the finals in the 
Shamrock Golf Tourna 
ment Sunday Pat. 13 
year old son of M r and 
M rs E  J  Windom. took 
second place in the third 
flight of the tourney, 
losing his bid for the 
championship on the I 8th 
hole.

t t t
M r and M rs Carl 

Ashby of Fort Worth 
spent the weekend visit­
ing with Mrs R N  Ash 
by and the Homer W il­
sons Sunday visitors 
were M r and M rs Paul 
Ashby of Amarillo 

t t t
M r. and M rs Elton 

Johnston. J r .,  and son. 
Dickie of San Angelo are 
visiting this week with his 
parents, M r and M rs 
Elton Johnston, and his 
grandmother. M rs J  P 
Alexander
30 Y E A R S  A G O ...
Lester Campbell. Ed

M r. and M rs Wes 
Laiigham of Pampa vis­
ited Friday night and 
Saturday in the home of 
his parents. M r and 
M rs T  A  Langham 
Saturday night and Sun 
day visitors in the Lang 
ham home were M r and 
M rs Ervin Baker and 
family of Pampa 

t t t
Fire of an undeter 

mined origin damaged 
the Dawson Magnolia 
Station, on the north lane 
of U  S Highway 66 in 
McLean, to the extent of 
more than S I.000 early 
Sunday afternoon 

t t t
M r and Mrs Bill Chis 

lett and children  of 
Com p to n , C a lif ., and 
M rs Glen Kenkcl of 
Courtland, Calif . visited 
in the Clyde Willis home 
Tuesday 
40 Y EA R S  A G O  
T  A  Landers. Ed

Clyde Carpenter, who 
has been In training in 
California for the past 
three months as a naval 
cadet, has successfully 
completed his pre flight 
course and was trans 
ferred this week to the 
Naval A ir Station at Oak 
land. C a lif . where he Is 
now ready to begin his 
primary flight training 

t t t
A  white leghorn hen 

belonging to M rs M  D 
C urry laid .an egg mea 
surtng 8 by Sty Inches 
last week M rs Curry 
had the egg on exhibition 
in McLean Saturday It 
appeared to have two 
shell*

t t t
The All-Church Conn 

cil of Women will be 
hoe teas to enlisted men 
and their wives at a baa 
ket picnic Thursday July 
l .  at the d ty  pash, be­
ginning at S 30 p m

50 YEA R S  A G O  
T  A  Landers. Ed

M r and M rs Thos 
A sh b y and son and 
daughter. N orvin  and 
Miss Nora, were in Altus, 
O klahom a, last week, 
where Norvin had his 
tonsils removed 

t t t
Aid will be asked of the 

National Industrial Re 
covery Act. for $15,000 to 
build a cheese factory at 
McLean, according to ac 
tion taken by the city 
council Monday after 
noon Several interested 
citizens appeared before 
the council in behalf of 
the cheese factory, and 
due to the short time In 
which to file requests for 
aid. It was voted to ask 
for aid in the name of the 
city and later turn the 
proposition over to a pri 
vate individual stock 
company, or whatever 
plan the people desire 

t t r
News from Pakan.........

Paul Macina. W  H. 
Bruice, Susan and E d ­

ward Pakan and Paul 
Stauffer were in Wheeler 
Saturday afternoon 
60 Y E A R S  A G O  
T  A  Landers. Ed

Dwight Upham had a 
very painful accident 
Tuesday While helping 
to pull a stalled auto with 
a horse and saddle, the 
saddle girth broke and 
gave him a nasty fall, 
spraining one ankle 
pretty badly He is now 
walking on crutches, but 
doing as nicely as could 
be expected 

t t t

The Board of Directors 
of the McLean Melon 
Growers Association met 
Wednesday and elected 
F  P Wilson as sales 
manager and A  W  
Haynes as inspector for 
the com ing season 
E ve ryth in g  is being 
shaped up to handle this 
year s Texas sweethearts 
from McLean to the best 
advantage to the local 
membership 

t t t

A  number of young 
people enjoyed a party at

the home of M r and M rs 
I D  Shaw Tuesday even­
ing Outdoor games and 
musk were the principal 
forms of entertainment 
Refreshments of punch 
and cake were served to 
the following Misses 
M in n ie  M o rse, Sallle 
C a m p b e ll, Ruby

and
M ary Anderson. Vera 
Wilson. Laura Bumpus. 
Lula Peters, Mamie Bur­
rows, Inez and Jewel 
Shaw; Messrs Houston 
Bogan. Hansel Christian, 
Charles Jordan, Bryan 
Burrows. J  F Watkins. 
Jo hn  H aynes. E m e ry  
Crockett and Jenkins 
Shaw
70 Y E A R S  A G O  
A  G  Richardson. Ed 

F  H  Yokcly last week 
completed negotiations 
whereby he takes over 
the entire ranch holdings 
of John W  Puckett, 
known as the old Byron 
ranch, about fifteen miles

nortUust of this city 
The consideration was 
not made known but the 
deal involved a consid­

erable sum Included in 
the transfer were about 
twenty two hundred head 
of the cattle, twenty head 
of horses and other 
equipment, also the

dif
ferent land leases, some 
of which run for several 
years Mr Yokely has
installed Clyde Cash 
ranch boss and will begin 
immediately the work ^

refurnishing and fixing 
up the ranch headquar 
ters where he will also 
make his home 

t t t
Prominent among the 

visitors in the city is J  L 
Davis of Nocona. Texas, 
who is spending

some
time here as the guest of 
his nephew. Geo Bour 
land M r Davis was I- 
dentified with the pioneer 
builders of Texas, having

come to this state in 1854 
and settled on what was 
then our frontier 

t t t
Twenty ladies respon­

ded to invitation given by 
M rs S O  Cook on 
Thursday afternoon to 
meet her guest. Mrs 
Siler Faulkner of Lefors 
After spending a delight­
ful hour in merry jests

and pleasantries of the 
day. score cards were 
handed round designat­
ing their palces at the 
tables for progressive 
forty two Game

suc­
ceeded game sending the 
players to mingle with 
each Pine Apple Ice 
Cream and cake were 
served after which, with

M rs Roy Rice at the pi 
a no and a chorus of 
voices to trill the melody 
of a number of popular 
songs, another hour 
melted away M rs 
Cook s ability to entertain 
is never doubted and 
each guest was loth to say 
goodbye when time for 
departure arrived

Applications Still Available For Camp
Applications are now 

available at The McLean 
News office and at the 
American National Bank 
in McLean for the Me 
Lean Basketball Camp 
which has been set for 
July 11-15 The camp 
will be directed by Sheri 
Haynes who has coached 
the past four years at 
Lockney High School 
She will be assisted by 
Sam D Haynes who is 
currently  coaching at 
Clarendon High School 

The camp will run from 
9 a m  to 4 p m in the 
M cLean H igh  School 
gymnasium Boys and 
girls will be taught fun­
damental drills, game 
situations, and will be 
given short lectures con 
cernmg the mental aspect 
of competition

A  camp demonstration 
has been set for the F ri­
day following the week of 
camp

Boys and girls who will 
be fifth, sixth, seventh, 
or eighth graders in the 
school year of 1983 84 
will be eligible to attend 
The camp will be limited 
to the first fifty boys and 
girls who sign up

Cost for the camp is 
$50 for approximately 
thirty hours of instruc­
tion. a personalized 
t sh irt, and insurance 
coverage for the camp A 
deposit of $25 should ac 
company the registration 
and the remaining may 
be paid the first day of 
camp No refunds will be 
made. Miss Haynes said

% •
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The oldest limns things 
•re bnstlecone pine trees, 
which scientists believe may 
have started growing from 
4 000 to b 000 yean ago

It is foolish to tear 
one s hair in grief, as if 
grief could be lessened
by baldness

Ckero

T H E  T W O  M c L E A N  teams played each other in the 
final home game for the groups last week In 
McLean The two teams are Dlayinq this week in a

BIR THDAYS

tournament at Clarendon to end their season 
Tuffy Sanders tags up on first base before the ball 
is pitched to first baseman Daniel Harris \Photo 
by Linda Haynes|

Of). JACK L  DOSE
o m u tn isr

l it  H e* ikemrw* Is  
rew r M IJ U J  
Tee rd ry S -J J

CARWASH
Saturday

10-3
American National 

Bank Parking Lot
Sponsored by United Methodist Youth Fellowship

JU N E  23 
Jill Mane Page 
Mike Butolph 
Alvin Danner 

JU N E  24
M rs S A  Cousins 
Duwayne Blackshear 
Jim m y Linn West 

JU N E  25 
Melvin McCabe 
Betty Throckmorton 

JU N E  26 
None

JU N E  27 
Don Cash 
Susie Billingsley 

JU N E  28 
Richard Moore 
Mrs Edgar Smith 
M rs Don Trew 
Carl Lee Henley 
Teresa Tolleson 

JU N E  29
M rs Charles Cousins 
Mrs R W  Leathers 
Jim m y Baker 
Brinda Lowe

On the average, a person takes in i 
water during hit lifetime.

16.000 ga*1 of

Ritz C R A C K E R S  
16 oz $128
Honey Maid Graham CR ACKER S 
1 lb 98c
Nabisco Oreo C O O K IE S  
19 oz $1 48

7 UP
6 pack • 12 oz -98c 
Hunts Barbeque S A U C E 
18 oz - All Flavors 98c 
Comstock Lite PIE FILLIN G  
Cherry or Apple 21 oz $1 18 
Comstock Lte Blueberry PIE FILLING 

21 oz - $1 68 - 
Camay Bath SOAP 
5 oz 2 for 98c 
M  — * 'A N D Y
Hain oi 'eanut King Size Bag 
3 for 98c
Campbell s Cream of Chicken SOUP 
10 5 oz. • 3 for 98c 
Tree Top Apple JU IC E  
64 oz. - $1 78

D A IR Y

Borden s H i Protein M ILK 
ty gal $1 08 
Borden's B U T T E R M IL K  
ty gal -$ 1 0 8  
Borden's Fruit D R IN K  
1 gal Asst Flavors 78c 
Kraft Orange JU IC E  
64 oz $1 58
Kraft Parkay M A R G A R IN I 
1 lb quarters 2 for 88c

F R O Z E N  FO OD S

Borden's Nutty Buddy or Ice C r 
Sandwkhes 6 pack 98c 
Van De K a m p  s Fish F IL L E T  
24 oa $2 88 
Banquet Fried C H IC K E N  
21b S2 38
Birdseye Little Cob CORN
8 ears $1 18
Banquet C R E A M  PIES
All Flavor* 14 oc 60c ______

Fantastik CLEA N ER  
64 oz - Refill $1 88 
Fab Laundry D E T E R G E N T  
49 oz $1 68

Meads Cinnamon ROLLS 
Pkg 78c
Solo Plastk PLA TES  
15 ct - 9  Inch 78c 
Vlask Dill PICKLES 
32 oz. • All Types 98c 
Post Toasties C E R E A L 
18 oz 98c

M E A T

US D A  Choke Beef Cube S TE A K S  
$198 lb
U S D A  Choke Beef Beef Cubes for Bar
B C U E  $1 98 lb
U S D A  Choke Beef Blade Cut Chuck 
S T E A K  $1 28 lb
U S D A  Choke Beef Boneless Rolled 
R O A S T $1 78 lb
U S D A  Choke Beef Boneless C H U C K  
S T E A K  $1 78 lb 
Hillshire farm smoked SAUSAG E 
Reg. beef or kailbaska $1 88 lb 
Decker C H IC K E N  FR A N K S  - 12 oz 
Decker C H IC K E N  FR A N K S  
12 oz pkg • 78c

n S h o D U s R e s u l la r ly  1
________ FOR REOUlflR POOP «MOGSI |

Palmolive Liquid Dish D E T E R G E N T  
32 oz $1 18

Hi Dr! TO W E L S  
Roll 2 for 98c 
Delta Bath TIS S U E 
4 Roll 88c
Meads Cracked Wheat B R EA D  
l t y  lb 68c

Luzianna Family T E A  BAGs
T E A B A G S
24 ct . - $1 48
Ranch Style P IN TO  B E A N S
15 oz 3 for 98c
Libby SLOPPY JO E  M IX
15 oz 98c 
Green Giant CORN
Cream Style or Whole Kernel
17 oz 2 for 78c
Green Giant S W E E T  PEAS
16 oz 2 for 78c
Maxwell House Instant C O F F E E  
10 oz $3 98 
Kings Hawaiian ROLLS 
9 oc 68c
Hills Bros C O F F E E  
All Grinds 1 lb $1 98 
No Pest Indoor FO G G ER  
7 S oz $2 78

P R O D U CE

California C A U L IF L O W E R  
98c head
California P E A C H E S  
58c lb

C A N TA L O U P E  
28c lb
T O M A T O E S  
3 lbs for 98c 
W hite O N IO N S 
18c lb 

•CARROTS 
1 lb pkg 5 for 98c
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Two Wrecks Reported Near McLean This Week, According To DPS Trooper Holland
Department of Pub 

lie Safety trooper report 
ed two wrecks this week 
The first wreck occurred 
June 14 at 12 30 p m  
when two cars collided at 
the intersection of In 
terstate 40 and Texas 
state highway 273 A 
1971 Ford Mustang, dnv 
en by Joel Estrada. 27. of

Lane Winner 
In Cutting 
Horse Contest

A  large number of 
cutting horses gathered 
in the Felton Webb All 
Stell Arena Friday af 
ternoon for the annual 
Ranch C u ttin g  Horse 
Contest W inning the 
event this year was Dave 
Lane Second and third! 
places went to Jerry 
H o w e ll, who entered' 
three horses in the con 
test

M cLe a n , traveling on 
273. struck a 1983 Ford 

van. driven by Steven 
Norman Chitty 45, of

Amarillo The initial 
contact was in the left 

hand lane of travel of 
I 40 There were no in

juries in the accident 
The second wreck oc 

curred June 17 Tim  
Lynn Pinion. 25. of Arap

a ho Ok la . apparently 
w«nt to sleep at the wheel 
of his Chevrolet pickup 
The vehicle moved to the

left of the road and hit a 
barricade He was In­
jured but received no 
treatment

'Best Parade In Years ’ Crowd Says
Most of the crowd a 

greed that it was the best 
parade in years Saturday 
afternoon The annual 
McLean 66 Rodeo and 
Roundup Parade wound 
its way from the far north 
end of Main Street, past 
the City Park, and then 
into the downtown area

with a large number of 
colorful entries 

Receiving trophies for 
best floats were Thomas 
Nursing Center, first.

Jerry Don Motors of 
Pampa. second, and the 
V F W  Auxiliary, third 
Judged the best riding 
clubs were the Donley

Annual God And Country 
Celebration Set For July 3

County 4 H , first, Sunny 
Skies of Pampa. second 
and Leila Lake Club, 
third Best individual 
trophies went to the Pan

7 X

handle Clowns, first. Ra 
mon § Pack Horse, sec 
ond. and United Method 
ist Church Clowns for 
Chirst, third

The Dutch once believed 
that it t  stork built its nest 
on the root ot youi house, 
it meant the best ot luck

The annual God and 
Country Celebration has 
been set tor July 3 at 7 30 
p m  in the McLean City 
park The event is spon 
sored by the McLean 
Ministerial Association 
Lloyd Hunt was appoint 
ed master of ceremonies, 
and Roger Myers is the 
music director

The service will be the 
same as last year with 
each church providing a 
youth speaker and an 
adult speaker with three 
to five minutes allotted to 
each speaker Each 
church will also bring a 
special song

Ice cream and cake will 
be served after the ser­
vice

a - a T a  t a n  z o w p . ' t s .  e<zc<e r j w s
a s p  w e  a __ - A f  "o n < /

MEDICARE 
SUPPLEMENT 

POLICY
NEW MEDICARE PRODUCT 

AVAILABLE N O W

.RINPHTl 
IN MOST CASES 

WILL RESULT IN 
1007. COVERAGE

■SEE US-

JANE SIMPSON AGENCY
106 A  N Main McLean. T X  7797451

Duckett's (1ER
J E  We Give TOP Savings Stamps ^

DR.PEPPER

M E A T
Quarter Sliced Pork LOIN 

$1.39 lb.
Center Cut Pork CHOPS 

$2.19 lb.
Pork ROAST 

$1.29 lb.
Smokey Canyon Boneless 

TU R K E Y  H A M  
$1.59 lb.

Price s Pimento Cheese 
& Bacon Spread 

IV 2 oz. 79c
Korn Kist BACON 
2 lb. pkg. $2.98

Armour’s Chicken Fry 
P A TTIES  
$1.59 lb.

PRODUCE
Texas CANTALOUPES 

29c lb.
Washington Bing CHERRIES 

99c lb.

Cal. Seedless GRAPES 
69c lb.

Cal. Leaf L E TTU C E  
2 heads for 79c 

Cal. CAULIFLOW ER 
89c each

Crisco OIL

Nestea Instant TE A  
3oz. Jar $1.89

G u ck e tt’s Q C R

32 oz. Jar - 20c off 
$1.29

Borden’s Fruit DRINK 
Gallon 79c

Borden’s Hi Protein Low Fat 
M ILK

V2 gal. $1.25 
Borden s Cottage CH EESE 

24 oz. - Lite line or Reg. 
$1.39

Keebler Rich n Chip 
COOKIES 

13 oz. bag $1.29

Keebler PECAN SANDIES 
13 oz. bag $1.29

CASCADE 
85 oz. box $3.99

‘M S
COOKIE 

SALE f -

Keebler Coconut Chocolate 
Drop COOKIES 

13 oz. bag $1.29

Hormel Chunk HAM 
63/4 0z. can $1.09 

Griffin’s Barbecue SAUCE 
38oz.jar 99c 

Del Monte Pineapple JUICE 
46 oz. can $1.19 

Nabisco Honey GRAHAMS 
lib . box $1.19 

M ILN O T
13 oz. can 2 for 89c

Dixie PLATES 
100 Count 89c

Mile High Cut Green BEANS 
303 can 3 for 89c 

Mile High Golden CORN 
Whole Kernel, Cream Style 

303 can 3 for $1 
Mile High TO M A TO E S  

303 can 2 for 79c 
Argo PEAS 

303 can 3 for $1 
Kuner’s PEARS 

303 can 2 for $1.09

12 oz. can - 6 pack 99c 
LIM IT

Borden’s PUDDING BARS 
12 pack $1.79 

Stillwell COBBLER’S 
32 oz. $1.59

T  V. Krinkle Cut P O TA TO ES 
2 lb. bag 99c

Borden’s B U TTE R M ILK  
V2 Gallon Carton $1.25

Borden’s H ALF & H ALF 
16 oz. Carton 69c 

Borden’s Sour Cream & Dips 
8 oz. carton 69c 

Minute Maid LEM O N A D E 
12 oz. can 59c 

Borden’s Old Fashion ICE 
CR EAM  - V2 Gal. Round Crtn 

$1.69
Borden’s SHERBERT 

V2 gal. $1.69 
Borden’s FR U IT BARS 

4 pack $1.29

Good Value Peach 
PRESERVES -18 oz. jar-89c 
Post Honey Comb CER EAL 

14 oz. box $1.59 
Thank you Cherry Pie 

FILLING • 89c
Wishbone Cheddar Cheese & 

Bacon SALAD DRESSING 
8 oz.jar 69c

uckett’s
We Give TOP S<tvinqs Stamps
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