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Dryland Farmers Look 
To Crop Alternatives
Possibilities Peas,Sunflowers Or Grain

"I have been visiting with 
farmers throughout the coun­
try,” said Bailey County Exten­
sion Spencer Tanksley. "It is 
their opinion that if we do not 
receive two or three inches of

planting moisture by July 10, we 
will be without a dryland crop 
this year."
Tanksley added, "I don't be­

lieve most dryland farmers can 
plant now. Many farmers after

Potato Soil Moisture 
Critical During June

DRYLAND HAZARD . . . This field shows billowing smoke and 
fiercely burning wheat stubble, another dryland hazard as there is 

1 not sufficient moisture to keep parched fields from burning rapidly 
when accidentally ignited. This field, northeast of Muleshoe.

burned Thursday afternoon after nearby residents reported they
walked out and "found the field burning and don’t know how or why
it started."

Roger Miller Park  
Concession Robbed

Vivian Briscoe, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. W.C. Briscoe, and 
a student at Muleshoe High 
School, is now participating in 
work and an environmental 
study program She is part of 
the National Buffalo Lake Na­
tional Wildlife Refuge Youth 
Conservation Crops near Can­
yon, according to Bryce Slack, 
YCC Camp Director.• * • * *

Honorable mention in the form 
of a parchment certificate of 
excellence was presented Tena 
Landers, 12 year old daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Landers, 
for her participation in the 
fourth annual U-Haul U-Color 
contest. • * * * *

Mrs. Joe Carroll was reported 
Friday to be sightly improved at 
St. Mary's Hospital in Lubbock 
where she had been listed in 
serious condition following sur­
gery last week.

• • • • *
For the opening of TEXAS at 

Paladuro, on June 16, they had 
a photography contest.
Mike Jones of Muleshoe enter­

ed a photograph and received an 
honorable mention on it. His 
photograph was of the Moore 
place, sited three miles south of 
Baileyboro cemetery.
Jones won two free tickets to 

TEXAS for his prize. He is a 
Journalism major and has been 
employed at West Texas State 
University as their photogra­
pher for the school.

Brent Blackman, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. M.S. Blackman, had 
emergency surgery in Metho­
dist Hospital in Lubbock last 
Friday night, about 10:30 p.m. 
Blackman is reported as recov­

ering nicely. He will probably be, 
released the latter part of this 
week.

Local Youths 
In Competition

Several members of the Pro­
gress 4-H youths were in Lub­
bock the first of last week to 
participate in the 12th annual 
District Two 4-H Horse Show. 
Although they did not place 
high enough to represent the 
local 4-H in state competition, 
they did come home with some 
good wins.
Top winner locally from among 

the 207 contestants in the 
registered gelding, under five, 
was Casey Farmer, while Tom­
my Wheeler was sixth in the 
same event.

In grade mares. Sharia Farmer 
won third; Shane Claunch was 
sixth and Curtis Wheeler, 
eighth.
Julie Claunch was 12th in 

registered geldings over five.
In eighth place in grade geld­

ings was Curtis Carpenter.
Kenny Henderson was seventh 

in reining and Curtis Carpenter 
was eighth.

For polcbending, Sharia Farm­
er was sixth and Delia Shaw, 
ninth; Jaohn Warren was tenth 
in barrels.

According to Eugene Howard, 
president of the Mulesoe Little 
League, and Muleshoe City 
Police Reports, the concession 
stand at Roger Miller Park was

broken into and robbed last 
Wednesday night.
Taken were two cases of potato 

chips, several boxes of candy 
and three one gallon jars of

Junior Rodeo Set; 
Starts Celebration

All the excitement of a rodeo 
will be here on Friday, July 2, 
when the Muleshoe Junior Ro­
deo is scheduled to start at 8 
p.m. with the grand entry. 
Scheduled on Friday, July 2 and 
Saturday. July 3, the rodeo 
heralds the approaching annual 
July 4 celebration.

Mrs. Leon Spears said numer­
ous entries are expected for the 
popular rodeo to be held two 
miles south of Muleshoe at the 
Muleshoe roping arena.
There will be one go round, 

with a split performance. Al­
though late entries will be 
accepted, the books will close at 
6 p.m. on Thursday, July 1.

In the age 12 and under group, 
entries will be steer riding, 
break way roping, barrel racing, 
flag race, pole bending, rescue 
race ana girls' goat tying.
For the 13-15 year old age 

group will be steer riding, tie

Dog And Cat 

Rabies Clinic 
Set Thursday
According to an announcement 

by City Secretary Mary Wat­
kins, the annual Dog-Cat Rabies 
Clinic is schedules for Thurs­
day, July 1, at the Muleshoe 
Volunteer Fire Department on 
East Avenue B.
Hours for the clinic will be 3 to 

5 p.m. with Dr. Jerry Gleason 
innoculating the animals for 
rabies.
This year, said Mrs. Watkins, 

the cost for rabies shots will be 
$4 and SI additional for the city 
tags.
Persons with dogs and cats are 

being urged to have their pet at 
the clinic on that date for the 
rabies shots.

Savings Bonds 
April  Totals 
A re Released

Mrs. Dean Sprabcrry, county 
chairman for the Savings Bond 
program in Bailey County, re­
ported sales of Scries E and H 
United States Savings Bonds in 
the amount of S3,220 for April 
1976. Sales for the first four 
months of the year totaled 
$21,518 which represents 27 
percent of their assigned dollar 
goal.

Sales in Texas during the 
month amounted to S21.912,800

down calf roping, ribbon roping, 
breakaway roping, barrel rac­
ing, flag race, pole bending, 
rescue race and girls’ goat 
tying.
Events for the 16-18 year olds 

will be cow riding, tie down calf 
roping, ribbon roping, breakway 
roping, barrel racing, flag race, 
pole bending, chute dogging,' 
team roping and girls’ goat 
tying.

Cont. on Page 2, Col. 1

Firs! Baptist 
Youth Attend 
Church Camp

Last weekend was a special 
time at the First Baptist Church 
in Muleshoe according to youth 
director Kenneth Carter. He 
said a group of 17 senior high 
school youth and six sponsors 
went to the Spiritual Growth 
Cabin located on White River 
Lake for a weekend retreat.

Richard Jones from the First 
Baptist Church of Burleson was 
keynote speaker and Bible in­
structor.

Following Bible study, fellow­
ship and fun time on Friday, the 
group viewed the film "Surviv­
al.”

"Saturday morning saw each 
person spending time alone with 
God and Nature and a special 
time of commitment to God,” 
added Carter. Saturday after­
noon was spent at the Recre­
ational Facilities of the First 
Baptist Church of Lubbock for 
roller skating, volleyball and 
basketball.

Attending the retreat were 
Melissa Biggcrstaff, Beverly 
Biggerstaff, Shanon Kennedy, 
Mark Benedict, Joy Frazier, 
Rickey Grogan. Debbie Purcell, 
Cynthia Rogers, Tom Crow. 
Royce Hamilton, Randall Hamil­
ton, Terry Shafer, Mark North- 
cutt, Mike Northcutt, Becky 
Turner, JoRonda Rhodes, Fran 
Dunbar, Kenny Carter, Patsy 
Carter. Richard Jones. Ronnie 
Holt, Sue Holt. Tony Cline and 
Linda Cline.
On Sunday morning and 

throughout the day. all of the 
youth of the First Baptist 
Church were involved in Dis- 
ciplcship Seminars. The servic­
es and seminars were led by a 
four member team from the 
Student Ministry Section of 
Texas Tech. The day was con­
cluded by a youth fellowship in 
the fellowship hall of the First 
Baptist Church at Lubbock.

pickles.
Howard said this is the fifth 

time the concession stand has 
been burglarized this year. The 
first time was during the winter, 
before there were any candy or 
concession supplies, so, taken 
were the public address amplifi 
er and speakers, as well as two 
sets of umpire equipment.
Then, after the season began, 

the concession stand has been 
broken into and cleared out four 
times, with a total loss of at least 
S300 in candy and an additional 
S300 in equipment.

"The thieves added a new 
touch in their last visit Wednes­
day night,” commented How­
ard, “ they attempted to burn 
down the concession stand be­
fore leaving. Fortunately, the 
fire burned itself out without 
causing any major damage.

“ A new door is being installed 
on the Little League concession 
stand and it is hoped that this 
will prevent further burglar­
ies.”
The Chamber of Commerce 

Reward Fund of $100 is offered 
to anyone who will furnish 
information on the identity of 
the person or persons who have 
been robbing the Little League 
( ncession stand.

Howard urges anyone who can 
supply this information to 
please contact Chief of Police 
Buddy Black at the Law En­
forcement Center.

High Plains potato growers are 
watching their potato plants 
closely during the next few 
weeks to make sure their crops 
avoid moisture stress, according 
to Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service researchers and Bailey 
County Extension Agent, Spen­
cer Tanksley. According to the 
local agent, some are finding 
the soil moisture tensionmeters 
effectively do the job.

Irish potatoes are very sensi­
tive to soil moisture fluctuation 
during June, cautioned the 
county agent. This is when the 
potato plants reach peak vegeta­
tive growth and the tubers are 
enlarging rapidly. Any extended 
period of drought stress during 
this period will retard the rate of 
tuber enlargement, and the 
ultimate consequence will be a 
lower yield of premium size 
tubers at harvest.

He said this means growers 
have to irrigate often enough to 
keep the soil moisture tension 
from exceeding 30 centibars at 
the 12-inch depth in the row. In 
the past, they have relied on 
rough estimates of soil moisture 
which involved handling the soil 
and observing the plants. There 
is now strong evidence, said 
Tanksley, which shows that 
these subjective measurements 
no longer guarantee the best 
timing of irrigations.

Research conducted by the 
Texas Agricultural Experiment 
Station at Lubbock and at the 
Munday Vegetable Research 
Station has shown that tenion- 
meters provide a more accurate 
and reliable method of sensing 
moisture stress in potato soils 
than traditional methods. The 
tensionmeter is a reliable and 
inexpensive instrument, he ad­
ded. When placed in the root 
zone of heaviest water absorp­
tion, the tensionmeter measures 
the amount of tension in the 
moisture film moving from the 
soil into the potato root system.
One tensionmeter for each 

irrigation set within a large field 
is a practical investment. Its 
positioning in the field is impor­
tant. In fields where rows are 
about one quarter mile long and 
can be irrigated quite uniformly.

Seals Attend Annual 
State Heart Meet

Mr. and Mrs. Don Seales 
represented the Bailey County 
Division of the American Heart 
Association at that organiza­
tion's 41st Texas Affiliate Annu­
al Assembly held last week in 
Houston.
Over 300 delegates, officers 

and committee members attend­
ed the three-day meeting at 
Houston's Shamrock Hilton Ho­
tel.
The meeting featured training 

and orientation workshops, the 
introduction of a new five-year 
goal document and the presen­
tation of the first Lyndon Baines 
Johnson Research Award.
The new five-year goal docu­

ment. the Texas Affiliate's 
"plan of action” through 1981, 
stresses the AHA’s heavy in­
volvement in programs design­
ed to change the health behavior 
of Texans concerning smoking, 
diet, physical exercise and high 
blood pressure, as well as 
educational programs in cardio­
pulmonary resuscitation and in­
creased expenditures for cardio- 
vasclar research.
The LBJ Research Award hon­

oring the late President was 
presented to Dr. James M. 
George, University of Texas 
Health Science Center in San 
Antonio, whose research appli­
cation for funding received the 
highest meritorical ranking by 
the AHA's Center Research

Review Committee.
The award was presented to 

Dr. Robert O'Rouke, who accep­
ted for Dr. George, by Mrs. Luci 
Johnson Nugent, daughter of 
the late President. The award, 
to be given annually, is funded 
by contributions from the Hon-
Cont. on Page 2, Col. 2

No A rrests  Yet

In L oca l  Death  
In Early June
Several people have been giv­

en polygraph examinations in 
Clovis in an attempt to find out 
who beat Traylor (Dude) Crouch 
so badly he died from his 
injuries early this month.

Sheriff Dee Dements said two 
persons were given lie detector 
examinations on Thursday and 
another person Friday as law 
enforcement officers continue to 
probe the murder of the local 
man.
The sheriff continues to praise 

the work and cooperation of the 
Clovis City Police Detectives, 
under leadership of Detective 
Captain Caleb Chandler, as the 
investigation progresses.

No arrests have been made in 
the death at presstime.

about 150 feet should be paced 
off from the head of the field 
inward on the sixth to eighth 
row from the edge. The tension­
meter is placed in the row 
between two plants, and is 
installed by grasping the shank 
of the instrument and pushing 
downward with a twisting mo­
tion so that the porous cereamic 
tip is about 12 inches down from 
the top of the bed, explained 
Tanksley.

It is not difficult to prepare a 
tensionmeter for field use, but
Cont. on Page 2, Col. 1

Crop Reports 

From Farmers 
Are Requested
In early July, about 24,700 

Texas farmers will receive an 
acreage and production ques­
tionnaire from W.H. Walther, 
Agricultural Statistician for the 
Texas Crop and Livestock Re­
porting Service in Austin.

Information from this survey 
will be used* to determine har­
vested acreage and production 
of early harvested crops for the 
state of Texas and for each 
county. Farmers who receive 
questionnaires are urged to 
complete and return them by 
mail, according to Walther. All 
individual reports are confiden­
tial and will be used only for 
state and county totals, he said. 
This survey is a cooperative 

effort of USDA’s Statistical Re­
porting Service and the Texas 
Department of Agriculture, ac­
cording to the statistician.

Spotted Rain  
Leaves Farms 
Little Water
Spotted rain in the area late 

Friday afternoon deposited .4 of 
an inch of rain in Muleshoe and 
up to .8 north of town.
Accompanied by high wind and 

small hail, the clouds formed 
near the New Mexico border 
and began their trak across the 
county. Mickey Sowder. two 
miles south of Stegall received 
.6 at the house, with small hail 
and .2 just a mile on south of 
that location.
On the Bud Street farm near 

Coyote Lake, there were a few 
sprinkles and not "enough to 
settle the dust" at their farm a 
little south of there.

Devastating hail was reported 
in the Clay’s Corner-Lazbuddie 
area, with corn reported to be 
stripped by hailstones on the 
Kirby Burch farm northeast of 
Lazbuddie, along with .8 of rain.

this time, the final date of July 
10, without water, will plant 
wheat, if moisture becomes 
available.”

According to figures and dates 
in the office of the county agent, 
approximate cutoff date for 
planting will be around July 10 
and some dryland producers will 
be looking for a “ quick” crop 
which may be peas, beans, 
grain sorghum or sunflowers. 
Tanksley said it may be too late 
to plant grain sorghum and 
many dryland producers will be 
better off to apply for disaster 
payments.

Ranges in the south part of 
Bailey County have suffered 
severely, continued Tanksley, 
and many producers are now 
faced with the situation of 
having to sell cattle.

"With today’s feed and hay 
prices,” he said, "the cow/calf 
producers cannot justify feeding 
them and have to sell.”

According to the extension 
agent, "Irrigationally speaking, 
things still look very bright. The 
only real problem is staying up 
with the water. It's a 24 hour a 
day job right now for corn and 
grain sorghum producers.

“ However, since we haven’t 
had any moisture, even some 
irrigated farms have not been 
able to be planted as the amount 
of water is not sufficient to bring 
up and produce a paying crop."
Tanksley said more corn fields 

will be reaching the tasseling 
and silking stage during the 
next two weeks and irrigation 
requirements move to .4 - .5 
inches of water each day.
"Therefore, if we don't get 

help it will be very important for 
producers to stay up with their 
irrigation,” cautioned the a- 
gent.

Cotton is making normal 
growth due to hotter, and in 
fact, recent scorching tempera­
tures in the area, he said. 
Helping make good cotton grow­
ing weather are also the cooler 
nights.

Many producers are in the 
process of completing the wheat 
harvest and irrigation yields 
have ranged from 45-60 bushels 
per acre, according to figures 
from the county agent's office. 
However, dryland wheat that 
can be cut has had a very low, or 
negligible yield.
Grain sorghum producers on 

irrigated land are finding their 
crops progressing very well and 
cultivation and side dressing are 
in progress at this time. He said 
that water requirements will 
increase as the plants reach the 
10-leaf stage.
Potatoes will be the first vege­

tables to be harvested in the 
area, according to the county 
agent and other vegetables are 
progressing. In a few isolated 
spots, onion harvest is just 
beginning in a small way. 
Tanskley estimated 35,000 ac­

res of cotton; 40,000 acres of 
corn and 30,000 acres of grain 
sorghum have been planted this 
year, with approximately 1,000 
acres of dryland receiving e- 
nough moisture to be planted. 
He also said that National 
Weather Service figures have 
Bailey County to be in the fourth 
driest area in the nation this 
year, along with several coun­
ties along the Texas border in 
Eastern New Mexico and Deaf 
Smith, Parmer, Hockley, Coch­
ran. Yoakum and Lamb Coun­
ties on the South Plains of 
Texas. There are an estimated 
300,000 acres not planted in 
these counties this year.

Young Homemakers 
Register 38 Groups

Muleshoe's Young Homemak­
ers said they had a very good 
response to the fire plug paint­
ing contest to be conducted in 
conjunction with the July 4 
celebration. A total of 38 entries 
were received, ranging from age 
6-17.

As the judging date nears, 
colorful ideas are showing up all 
around town with bright imagin­
ative colors and designs. The 
plugs will be judged on July 2 
with the winners announced on 
July 5 following the annual 
parade.
Drive through town and look at 

the results of the following 
young people who have bright­
ened the town with their paint 
brushes and imaginations.

Entries are: Tommy Carlson, 
15; Ricky Carlson, 10; John 
Wuerflein, 10; April Green, 12 
and Cara Bass, II; Rene Cop­
ley, nine; Boy Scouts Kenneth 
Maxwell and Casey Wilson; 
Boys Scouts Mike Holt and 
Shane Colter.
Also Boy Scouts, Lee and Andy 

Copley and Jay Stovall; Boys 
Scouts Brett and Wade King; 
Boys Scouts Gig Pierce and 
Scott Calvert; Boy Scouts Loy 
Triana and Chuck Bartholf; 
Melanie Blackwell, nine; and 
Denise Hunter, IS and Shellie

Reese, 15.
Also, R.G. Bennett IV, 10; 

Rachelle Hardage, nine; Lisa 
Bennett, nine; Janna Wuerflein, 
nine; Mark Northcutt, 13; Mike 
Northcutt, 14; Sherry henry, 12; 
Theresa Coleman, nine.

Also, Dyde Dever, Willie and 
Therman Coleman; Nettie Ruth 
Coleman, 13; Lance Free, nine;

Cont. on Page 2, Col. 1

B a n d  Members  
A sk ed  To Sign  

For B ig  P a r a d e
Tony Dines, Muleshoe High 

School Bandmaster, has asked 
that members and former mem­
bers of the Muleshoe High 
School Band participate in a 
march in the Independence Day - 
Parade in Muleshoe.
The parade is scheduled for 

Monday, July 5 at 4 p.m. and 
the beginning and ending point 
will be the Boy Scout Grounds 
on South Main.

He said there will only be one 
short rehearsal on Sunday, July 
4 at 2:30 p.m. in the High School 
Band Hall.

AN ALTERNATIVE. . .  This circle system effectively points out one of the alternatives to no crops in the 
area this year. Another alternative is the ditch type irrigation. Moisture has not been received in 
sufficient amounts to allow planting crops without the supplementary irrigation systems in the area.

>
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Potatoes...
Cont. from Paj>e 1 
proper servicing is of vital 
importance to successful opera­
tion, warned the county agent. 
Tensionmeters are usually ship­
ped dry and must be filled with 
distilled water with a green dye 
or blue dye that is supplied by 
the manufacturer. With the 
tensionmeter Filled, the ceramic 
tip is submerged in a pail of tap 
water. A vacuum test pump with 
a gauge, which can be purchas­
ed from tensionmeter manufac­
turers, is then used to extract air 
bubbles from inside. When 
these bubbles stop flowing up 
through the center, the tension­
meter is ready to be inserted 
into the soil.
The servicing of a working 

tensionmeter is simply a matter 
of restoring the water level in 
the reservoir about once every 
week or two, continued Tanks- 
ley.
Tensionmeter readings should 

be taken early in the morning 
because the soil moisture in the 
root zone has equilibrated 
through the night while the 

'plants are not actively ranspir- 
ing. If the reading is 20 centi­
bars or higher early in the 
morning, irrigation should be 
started in the field that day to 
prevent the tension from ex­
ceeding 30 centibars. Most 
growers who schedule irriga­
tions in this manner realize that 
in the past they have often 
allowed too much time to lapse 
between irrigations during the 
period of rapid tuber enlarge­
ment, he said.

Potato growers with clay loam 
soi|s find that running the water 
down every other row lessens 
the chances of tuber rot and 
rhizoctonia by avoiding a water­
logged condition of the soil 
around the tubers.

In most potato fields the root 
zone or upper 12 inches of 
top-soil will be moistened to 
field capacity from a 20 to 30 
centibar tension by applying 
about one and one half inches of 
water. In sandy loam only about
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Cont. from Page 1 
Lee Free, II; Adam Laredo, 13; 
Rebecca Barber, nine; Kim 
Wilson, 11; Dana Smith, 11 and 
Diane McGuire, 16.

Also, Jed Davis, 17; Steven 
Griswold, eight; Mary Graves, 
15; Jessie Beversdorf, 12; Angie 
Puckett. 13; Tommy Beversdorf, 
15; Terrie Martin, 12; Charles 
Martin, six; Karen Smith, 13; 
Frantony Berry hill, 14 and Man­
uel Garcia, 14.

Cont. from Page 1
An additional event will be pee 

wee calf riding for those young 
people eight years of age and 
under.
Mrs. Spears said all events will 

be open to both boys and girls 
except girls' goat tying.

Prizes will be pay back money 
to top winners of one half of the 
events’ entry fee.
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one inch of water is required to 
restore the top 12 inches to field 
capacity level. Irrigation in ex­
cess of this amount will usually 
cause water to move on down 
below the active root zone of the 
potato and is essentially wasted, 
concluded County Agent Tanks- 
ley.

Heart...
Cont. from Page 1
orableC.R. Smith; Stanley Mar­
cus, Dallas; the Leon Jaworski 
Foundation, Houston; the Inter­
national Fraternal Order of the 
Eagles; the LBJ Family Founda­
tion, Austin; the Brown Founda­
tion, Houston, and Mrs. J. Ed 
Connally and the late Mr. 
Connally, Abilene.

State officers for 1976-77 were 
elected and include Edwin J. 
Morrow, M.D., Houston, Presi­
dent; W.W. Aston, Dallas, 
Chairman of the Board; Ralph 
E. Johnson, CLU, Houston, Vice 
Chairman of the Board; Joseph
C. Ogle, M.D., Dallas, Presi­
dent-Elect; Mrs. David Har­
grave, Dallas, Secretary, and 
Robert A. Lightfoot, Jr., Sweet­
water, Treasurer.

Vice Presidents elected include 
J. Bryan Austin, Amarillo; Larry
D. Hickey, Fort Worth; Foyd F. 
Wilkerson, Dallas; A. Bryan 
Spires, Jr., M.D., Austin; Hen­
ry D. McIntosh, M.D., Houston, 
and Bernard H. Bloom, M.D.,
San Antonio.
The Bailey County Unit of the 

American Heart Association will 
have a noon meeting at the 
Corral on July 2. It is very 
important for all board members 
and officers to be present as the 
purpose of the meeting is to set 
goals for the year 1976 and 
1977.

Pioneer Sewing 
Class Over

The Pioneer Sewing group of 
Progress 4-H Club met Tuesday 
to complete their sewing pro­
jects. Sheila Hunt demonstrated 
Art-Tex painting to the girls and 
Dorinda Shafer painted her cup 
towel, thus completing her three 
items for the project.
Connie Puckett continued sew­

ing her apron and has complet­
ed her scarf to match it and 
equipped a sewing kit.
Twila Downing and Kacy Hen­

ry completed their projects on 
Monday evening. They each 
have an apron and headscarf to 
match and have decorated and 
equipped a sewing kit.
The girls met Friday in the 

home of Kacy Henry to com­
plete entry and narratives on 
their projects for the Dress 
Revue on June 29.

Sr. B abe  R u th  
Team Efforts  
A re  C on tin u in g
Senior Babe Ruth players have 

won one and lost two during the 
last several games with the 
up-to-date as follows:
Sunday. June 20, Muleshoe, 

4-1, with Billy Vinson as win­
ning pitcher.

Loss of Dimmitt of 1-6 on 
Tuesday, June 22.

A defeat by Olton at Olton on 
Wednesday of 8-11.

Jacob Javits. Senator (R- 
NY), to Kissinger: 
“Urge Mr. Ford to stick 

to his guns on Africa and 
not be distracted by polit­
ical winds.”

Gerald Ford, President: 
“If I get a good nuclear 

arms agreement with the 
Russians, I will submit it 
to Congress.”

Nursing 
Home News

by /Qyrtlt  Guinn
Mrs. Head came Tuesday to 

visit with her aunt. Miss Dottie 
Wilterding.

. . . . .
Ernest Green comes to see his 

mother. Mrs. Green. He often 
brings her a malt to drink. 

. . . . .
Mrs. Inez Sanders and a friend 

from Morton spent the day with 
her mother, Mrs. Hardin, on 
Wednesday. They also visited a 
daughter, Mrs. Ethel Veagin. 

. . . . .
Mrs. Tucker entered the nurs­

ing home on Monday. She is in 
room 80 with Mrs. Kaltwasser. 
She came here from Arizona to 
be near her two brothers. 

. . . . .
Mrs. Lula Vinson came to see 

Mrs. Guinn on Monday after­
noon. She also called on Mrs. 
Tucker while she was there. 

. . . . .
Mrs. Sybil Simpson of Clovis 

,came Monday and took her 
mother, Mrs. Brown, to see a 
specialist. We hope she recov­
ers soon.

. . . . .
Mr. Brown is ill and in bed at 

this time.

Visitors come often to see their 
people here. Everyone enjoys 
them much.

Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Stone 
visited their aunts, Mrs. Wal- 
ding on Monday.

Mrs. Weaver is improving. 
Her husband and family come to 
see her often.

Mrs. Boydston went to Amaril­
lo Monday to consult an eye 
specialist.

Pete Wileman is still feeling 
bad. We hope he recovers soon. 

. . . . .
Jack Harper comes to see his 

mother every day. Roy Williams 
comes to see his mother, Mrs. 
Williams often.

Mrs. Phue comes each after­
noon to be with her husband. 
Mrs. Maud Kersey visits Mrs. 
Phue and Mrs. Guin often. 

. . . . .
The Assembly of God singers 

came Sunday to sing for us. 
. . . . .

Mrs. Mae Provence is back 
home again with her mother, 
Mrs. Sein. We are glad to see 
her again.

The following little verse came 
to my mind again, recently and 
it follows:

‘‘The world has many happy 
folks who smile each day.they 
live, because they've found that 
happiness depends on what you
give.”

A smile and a cheery greeting 
makes each of us happier for 
having passed this way, so let's 
smile and see the good in our 
fellow man. We too, will be 
happier as the days come and
go-

ON EMOTION
CHICAGO--A Maryland 

psychologist, Dr. Paul 
Cameron of St. Mary’s Col­
lege, reports that a study 
he conducted debunks the 
notion that women are more 
emotional than men. He said 
women u su ally e xpress thei r 
their emotions more openly 
than men.

COTTON TALKS
f lo w  PioioK c o u o n  M O N r n  i u c .

Anyone Interested In Art?

John Birdsong
WATERCOLOR 

Jely 4-7-1 ft Days, ft Night

Oil Painting Workshop 
C hildren (n a p  

By Billie Homer  
ft DAY Jaly 19-23

Boll weevils, emerging earlier, in greater numbers and 
over a wider area than at any time since the mid-sixties, are 
poised for their annual strike at High Plains cotton fields.

Geared up to strike back with whatever force is necessary 
to repulse the attack is the High Plains Boll Weevil Control 
Program which has protected the area above the Caprock 
from weevils since 1963.

Weevil traps and trash samples at this early date show more 
weevils at more locations than have been seen since the con­
trol program was started in 1964. officials say. In fact the 
dreaded insect has been found in May of this year in some 
areas where in previous years he wasn’t seen until August or 
September.

All of which means, according to Ed Dean, Director of 
Field Services for Plains Cotton Growers, Inc., Lubbock, “we 
are going to have a bigger and tougher job this year.” PCG 
initiated the control program in conjunction with the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture in 1964 after entomologists warned 
that weevils were on the verge of becoming a severe problem 
in cotton production all across the organization’s 25 counties.

"There is no reason to believe,” Dean says, “ that we won’t 
be able to hold the line against weevils this year as we have in 
the past, but it’s pretty obvious now that we’ll have to spray 
a great many more acres than we have sprayed in a long 
time.”

Weevil traps are located along a 300-mile zig-zag line just 
above the Caprock from Briscoe County south through Floyd, 
Motley, Dickens, Crosby, Lubbock, Lynn, Garza, Dawson, 
Martin and Gaines Counties. All traps caught more weevils 
than is normal for May, confirming that the mild winter and 
early spring rains this year were conducive to a high survival 
rate among hibernating insects.

Insecticide sprayings are normally started in the last week of 
August and cover all acreage shown by trappings and manual 
surveys to have significant infestations. Cotton sprayed in the 
first application of 1975 came to only 22,300 acres. In-migra- 
tion of weevils from areas outside the program control zone 
during the season ballooned the total acreage treated at least 
one time to about 250,000.

Trapping records give a strong indication that in-migration 
in 1976 again will exert great pressure on the program. Only 
42 traps in the Swenson area of Stonewall County, outside the 
control zone, caught over 28,000 weevils in May of this year. 
By comparison, in the “hottest” part of the control zone, the 
Fluvanna area of Borden and Scurry Counties, 451 traps 
caught only a little over 10,000 weevils. All traps in the con­
trol zone averaged catching 12 weevils per trap while the 
average outside the zone was over 600 per trap.

And, officials point out, these figures also show how the 
control program has held down weevil populations within the 
treated zone

"Already this year we are finding weevils along the eastern 
edge of Lynn and Dawson Counties and at other points where 
in 1975 they didn’t show up until September,” Dean reveals, 
“which means we’ll very likely be starting out with a control 
zone double or perhaps triple the size of last year."

The Lieutenant Governor’s Report 
By Bill Hobby

AUSTIN-The Bureau 
of Business research at 
The University of Texas 
at Austin has prepared an 
outstanding summary of 
“Women Working in 
Texas.” This summary, 
written by Robert M. 
Lockwood, will be the 
su b jec t o f  several 
Lieutenant Governor’s 
Reports in the weeks 
ahead. This week’s report 
will discuss the female 
population and women in 
the Texas labor force.

In Texas, working 
women lag behind men in 
both pay and prestige. 
The problem is not 
u n e mp l o y me n t ,  but  
u n d e r e m p l o y m e n t .  
“ W o m e n ’s ”  w o r k , 
“women’s” wages, and 
e v e n  ‘ ‘ w o m e n ’s ’ ’ 
industries still exist here. 
Anglo females, however, 
fare better in the job

Happy Seamtresses 
Learn Hair Care
The YL 4-H Club ’Happy 

Seamstresses” sewing group 
met Friday, June 18, in the 
home of their leader, Mrs. Tom 
Flowers, to sew on their gar­
ments for the Dress Revue.
Attending the meeting were 

Dana Smith. Beth Harmon, Kim 
Wilson and Tamara Gilliland. 
Others attending the meeting 
and assisting with the sewing 
projects were Mrs. W.H. Muir- 
head and her daughter, Rene, 
from Dallas. Rene is a 4-H Club 
member in Dallas County.
The “ Happy Seamstresses" 

met again on Monday, June 21, 
at Chubby's Beauty Shop for a 
lesson on hair care. Chubby 
Douglass gave the program. 
The girls learned how to care for 
their hair and the use of various 
hair care products.
Each girl was given a comb and 

brush and learned how to care 
for their brushes properly. Mrs. 
Douglass also showed the girls 
how to trim off the split ends in 
their hair. The girls also learned 
proper care for their eyebrows 
and nails.

Members attending the meet­
ing were Beth Harmon and 
Tamara Gilliland. Also attend­
ing was one guest, Sharia 
Gardner from Portales, N.M.

Svr.-Mob.-Tm s .

Mary Houlette 
Till Palatial- Jaly 24-29

Free
Macrame Demonstration

The Splatter Shack
517 Main 

Friona, Texas 
247-3719

I

market than most black 
men and women and 
most Spanish language 
and Spanish surnamed 
p e r s o n s .  In thei r
occupations, their pay, 
and their status, most 
black and Spanish women 
in Texas remain at the 
bottom of the heap.

Although in Texas
more men than women 
are born, two accelerating 
trends prevent the natural 
i n c r e a s e  i n  
population - the excess of 
I ive b i r t h s  o v e r
deat hs  - from favoring 
men. First, more men die 
each year than do 
women. And second, the 
number of births is 
decreasing. Because males 
exceed females only at
b i r t h  and shor t l y 
thereafter, the male 
statistical advantage is 
steadily eroded by a 
falling birthrate.

T h e  n u mb e r  o f  
women - leaving aside 
migration-is increasing

relative to itself and 
relative to the number of 
men. Women in Texas are 
increasingly numerous in 
both younger and older 
age groups. From about 
the age of 19, women 
outnumber men in every 
age g r o u p .  Thus

college-age and voting-age 
women outnumber men 
of the same age, women 
in the prime working 
years outnumber men, 
and retirement-age women 
outnumber men.

Migration into and out 
of the state is the only 
other component of 
population change that 
modifies the effects of 
natural increase. During 
the fifties and sixties, 
when the rate of natural 
increase remained high, 
net migrat i on (the 
difference between the 
numbers of those moving 
in and out) contributed 
relatively little to the net 
growth of the Texas 
population.

Those few numbers 
available for the early 
seventies suggest that in 
Texas, as elsewhere, 
migration is apt to 
contribute increasingly to 
population change. The 
U. S. Bureau of the 
Census estimates that net 
in-migration accounted 
for about a third of the 
population gain in Texas 
between April, 1970 and 
July, 1973. Population 
estimates place the July, 
1975, female population 
of Texas at about 
6,240,000, a figure that 
would indicate a net gain

of more than half a 
million from April, 1970. 
If similar trends are 
sustained throughout the 
decade,  the female 
population in Texas in 
1980 would be about 
6,540,000 or almost half 
a million more women 
than men.

However  dramat i c  
female population trends 
in Texas have been, they 
are not as immediately 
s i gni f i cant  to the 
economy and the society 
as is the changing relation 
of women to the labor 
force.

The female labor force 
in Texas increased by 
more than a million 
between 1940 and 1970. 
Half of this gain was 
realized during the sixties, 
and about 43 percent of 
the increase occurred 
among women 45 years 
and older. The same 
trends, though much less 
pronounced, occurred in 
the national female work 
force. From less than a 
quarter in 1940, the share 
of women in the Texas 
labor force rose to 
three-eights in 1970. Men 
and women in the work 
force - in Texas as in the 
nation - got older through 
the forties and fifties.

 ̂  ̂ P lanning for a good  life c a lls  for a good 
ed u cation . And a good  life insurance plan.

L et’s talk. P ro fessio n ally .55

I V IC  BENFDICT

721 W. Ave. C 
Ph. 272-3218

S o u th w e ste rn  Life
/OtOfA. -pMXTK,1crf»UOK,

I

G ates open ♦ X* I. T . ♦S how  Start* 
8 :4 5  P .m . DRIVE • IN THEATRE at 9:15

MULISHOt. TVXAS

HI TH0H6HT 
HI WAS A 
m m  SHREWD
1USIHESSMAH!

* : •;

He Hew Overbought,
He New Sold At A less,
He Wes Always Competitive, 
He Kepi His Store Modem, 
His Clerks Wen Friendly,
He Slocked Excellent 

Merchandise,
He Kepi Good Books,

BUT....
HE NEVER ADVERTISED!

And, as a result. his business was never what it could have boon! Businossmon 
must lot thoir custorntrs, and potential customers, know that their merchandise 
is good, their store is mockm and prices, are competitive. * Nothing tolls this 
story better . . . .  ini this area . . . .  than the pages of The. . . .
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CLUB STEAKS.
RO U N D  BO N E

SWISS STEAK.
CENTER CUT

CHUCK ROAST. 
ARM ROAST... 
CHUCK STEAK. 
gr"o u n d “ beT f" " 7 ‘
SHORT RIBS.............
RIB STEAK................
BLADE CUT

CHUCK ROAST.........

WILSON'S CERTIFIED

WILSON'S SMOKED FULLY COOKED BONELESS

RA LEAN.
WATER
ADDED

HALF

WILSON'S CERTIFIED

MHO M l’ BOLO . GAJtLK AOtO
p ic h u o iu iv b c m h hWILSON'S

WILSON'S CERTIFIED

USDA
FOOD STAMP 

COUPONSBANANAS
RecLDellcious

APPLES
Y e l l o w

ONIONS.
LETTUCE

DAIRY
FOODS

Bordens 1/2 gal

COME TO PAY N SAVE. 
FOR YOUR 

W I C
CARD PURCHASES

COTTAGE CHEESE

1/2 gal. Round ctn,

WE G I V E  G U N N  B R O S  5 T A SS r  s
d6 u BLE STAMPS WEDNESDAY WITH 

$2.50 OR MORE PURCHASE 
WE REDEEM AND 3IVE STAMPS 

ON FOOO STAMPS
WE SELL AFFILIATED MONEY ORDERS 

PAYROLL CHECKS CASHED

i t t f t I CAN BLVD. OPEN Bam

WEXFORD CRYSTAL 
ITEM OF THE WEEK:

WITH EACH 
AND EVERY 

S3PURCHASE
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Progress 4-H 

Complete  

Project
The Progress Jr. 4-H Clothing 

group has completed six project 
meetings. Subjects have includ­
ed shoe buying, studying gar­
ments. labels and constructing 
garments.

At the final meeting Keva 
Roming gave a demonstration 
on accessories. Then each girl 
made a simple scarf. The girls 
will complete their garments 
and records before the judging 
on Monday and dress revue on 
Tuesday, June 29.

Those attending the meeting 
were Tori Hunt, Delia Shaw, 
and Keva Roming and leader,
Mrs. Roming.

Skovcer Honors 
Mrs. Robinson

Mrs. Paul Robinson, the form­
er Diane Howard was feted with 
a bridal shower Tuesday eve­
ning, June 22 from 7 to 9 p.m., 
in the Tri-County Community 
Room.
The table was covered with 

white embossed cloth, with a 
centerpiece arrangement of all 
shades of pink flowers.

Punch, nuts, mints and cookies 
were served from crystal ap­
pointments.
The hostess gift was red teflon 

cookware. Hostesses for the 
shower were Mrs. H.T. Toten.
Mrs. J.B. Copley. Mrs. R.B.
Seaton, Mrs. John Whisenhunt,
Mrs. A.C. Bryant, Mrs. Clar­
ence Bennett, Mrs. David Gray 
and Mrs. Johnnie Williams.

Miss Shelly Hargrove Feted With Shower
Miss Shelly Hargrove, bride- 

elect of Curtis Chester, was 
honored with a bridal shower on 
Saturday. June 19. in the home 
of Mrs. Joe Ellison. The serving 
table was laid with a white cloth 
edge in lace and centered with a 
bouquet of blue spider mums, 
daisy mums and carnations, 
sprigged with baby's breath.

Punch, cookies, mints and nuts 
were served from crvstal and

silver appointments. Those 
serving the guests were Lisa 
and Lori Harper, Francine 
Notes, Paula Ellison, Susan 
Cardwell and Deanna Flowers. 
The honoree was presented a 
corsage of blue daisy mums.
The hostesses alternated at the 

registering table. There were 58 
guests registered in the bride’s 
book. Cindy Moss assisted the 
honoree in opening and regis­

tering the gifts.
The Hostess gift was a set of 

cookware. Hostesses included 
Mrs. Kenneth Noles, Mrs. Ray­
mond Harper, Mrs. Marvin 
Bowling, Mrs. R.A. Lance, Mrs. 
Audry West, Mrs. G.C. Ritchie, 
Mrs. Floyd Seymore, Mrs. Louis 
Fields, Mrs. Glen Cardwell, 
Mrs. Pete Phillips, Mrs. Joe 
Ellison, Mrs. Clyde Flowers, 
Mrs. Leroy Young, Mrs. Tommy

Moss, Mrs. John Williams. 
Mrs. Frank Lane, Mrs. Leonard 
Pierce. Mrs. Waymond Bellar, 
Mrs. Ernest Legg. Mrs. Dale 
Hanna. Mrs. Bob Edwards and 
Mrs. Bob Nelson.
Out of town guests included 

Mrs. A.A. Sedgwick, of Kress 
and Mrs. J.L Hargrove of 
Lubbock, grandmothers of the 
bride-to-be; Mrs. J.R. Golden, 
of Brownfield and Mrs. Dale

Newsom, of Needmorc, aunts of 
the honoree; Mrs. Frak Prokop, 
of Odessa and Mrs. Claude 
Patton, of Lubbock, aunts of the 
prospective groom.
Other special guests included 

Mrs. Dorman Chester and Mrs. 
J.D. CHester, grandmother and 
great-grandmother of the pro­
spective groom; and Mrs. 
Wayne Doty, aunt of the pro­
spective groom. Other guests 
were Gina Masten. of Morton, 
Mrs. Calvin Wood of Earth and 
April Rudd of Lubbock.

Bingo Winners
The monthly bingo party was 

held Wednesday, June 23, at 
the Muleshoe Nursing Home. It 
was sponsored by the Junior 
Auxiliary.

Winners for the evening were 
Mammie Miller, Mary Spurlin, 
Nellie Norwood and Ben Kube. 
These people all won one game.
Those winning two games were 

Dottie Wilterding and Arthur 
Perkins. There were 13 in 
attendance.

Auillmrmo M o n la n a i

Mr. and Mrs. Manuel Montan­
ez of Clovis, N.M. are the proud 
parents of a new baby boy born 
June 23, 1976, at 12:41 p.m., in 
the West Plains Medical Center 
in Muleshoe. The baby weighed 
eleven pounds and one half 
ounce and was named Guiller­
mo. He is the couple’s seventh 
child.

Staphania Ann  Gore

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Wayne 
Gore of Midland are parents of a 
daughter, Stephanie Ann, born 
Friday, June 18 at 2:30 a.m. She 
weighed six pounds 11 ounces 
and was 19 inches long.
Grandparents are Mr. and 

Mrs. Wayne Doty, Sudan and 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy A. Gore of 
Circle Back. Great grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Evah Doty and 
Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Wells of 
Sudan. Great, great grandpar­
ents are Mr. and Mrs. Hugh 
Gore of Circle Back and Mrs. 
Marie Patton of Muleshoe.

West Plains 
iMedical Center 

Briefs
ADMISSIONS
June 23 - Mrs. Mike Chester, 

Hillis Duncan and Romelo Tos­
cano.
June 24 - Mrs. Jimmy Heard, 

Mrs. James Roy Jones, Billy 
McIntosh and Dwayne Shafer.
June 25 - Mrs. Thomas Tunnell 

and Maria Reyna.
DISMISSALS
June 23 - Mrs. George Hicks.
June 25 - Dwayne Shafer. Mrs. 

Mike Chester. Mrs. Manuel 
Montanez and son and Hillis 
Duncan.

*  *  *  *

Your time is of no val­
ue to anyone butyourself;
why not use_it wisely?

Meredith Douglas

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Douglas 
of Richard are the proud parents 
of a new baby girl born May 31, 
1976, at 2:59 p.m. The baby 
weighed seven pounds and 12 
ounces and was named Mere­
dith Lashell.
Grandparents are Mr. and 

Mrs. Buddy Blackman of Mule-1 
shoe; Mr. and Mrs. Warren 
Douglas, of Fort Worth. Great 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Arnold Morris of Muleshoe.

BIBLE VERSE
“ Watch therefore: for ye 

know not what hour your 
Lord doth come.”

1. Who gave the above 
warning?

2. To whom was he speak­
ing?

3. About what event was 
he speaking?

Answ ers To B ib le  Verse
1. Jesu s Christ.
2. To his twelve d isciples.
3. The coming of Christ to 

judgment.

All Spring and 
Summer Merchandise

Now

and

Sale Starts
Monday

June 28

n’te e n s
500  M A IN  C L O V IS  

7 6 3 -7 1 5 3
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What doyou have to do to 
get a good old"f ashioned 
lOOfo cotton denim iean 
that... £3.

• won't shrink out of size
• resists wrinkling
• resists puckering
• gets softer sooner
• stays stronger longer
• fits and fades beautifully

Just what you've always wanted a perfect jean that comes right out of the 
dryer right on your back with hardly a pucker or wrinkle.Our amazing Do-Nothing 14 oz. 
denim is made to outperform, outwash and withstand the toughest wear and tear of any 
other denim around. Plus the great Sedgefield styling and fit that's second to none. And best 
of all you get all this without paying one penny more than ordinary denim.

He who loves not his coun­
try can love nothing.

-Byron.
tion. Mrs. Spraberry is a gradu­
ate of Los Lunas, New Mexico 
High School, and a graduate of 
Eastern New Mexico University 
of Portales, New Mexico with a 
B.S. in Elementary Education 
and Early Childhood. She was 
employed by Clovis Municipal 
Schools to teach kindergarten. 
Out of town guests and rela­

tives attending the wedding 
included: Miss Carrol Payne. 
Miss Hester Gassett, Mrs. Ma­
ria Lawler. Mr. and Mrs. Joseph 
Blythe. Mr. and Mrs. Pat Mile- 
shosky and Bobby, all of Albu­
querque, N.M.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Thompson and Mrs. Mar­
vin Trembly of Belen, N.M.; 
Mr. and Mrs. A.A. Tuttle, and 
Mrs. Robert Blake of Bosque 
Farms. N.M.; Miss Karen Gar­
ner. Portales. N.M.; Mr. and 
Mrs. Lee Elliott of Hartley; Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Dillard. Toni and 
Shelley. Mr. and Mrs. Billie 
Dillard, all of Mustang. Okla.; 
Mrs. Edna Dillard. Mr. and 
Mrs. Bennie Dillard and Don, 
all of Roaring Springs; Mr. and 
Mrs. Vester Roller and Mrs. 
Eugene Watson of Plainview; 
Ruby Myers and Pete Ozborn of 
Lubbock; Mrs. Robin Pyle and 
Brandy, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Ortiz and Ernie. Mrs. Moreno 
and children all of Clovis. N.M.; 
Mrs. Loney Ballard of Corona. 
Calif, and Mr. and Mrs. David 
Luna and Brent of Amarillo.
A rehearsal dinner was given 

in honor of the couple at XIT 
Steak House. The event was 
hosted by the mother and 
grandmother of the groom, with 
the entire wedding party and 
Rev. and Mrs. H.D. Hunter 
attending.

The short-walsted woman 
—the one who wears half 
size d resses-w lll be glad 
to leam th a t these garments 
are much more attractive 
this season than they have 
been In past years. Some 
very lovely garments are 
being shown in shops, rang­
ing from size 12V4 and up.

Too many ge n i u s e s  
make for inefficiency.

S P E C IA L  S A V IN G S  O N  
H A N D C R A F T E D  S T E M W A R E  

BY . . . Jiiijirriaf
Now available at special 

savings . . . handcrafted Im­
perial Glass stem ware in pop­
ular patterns.

C ho ose H o ffm a n  H o u se  
w ith  its c la s s ic a lly  s im p le  
lines. Or graceful, Colonial- 
styled Old Williamsburg.

Imperial stem ware is avail­
able in colors and crystal in 
all sizes . . . goblets, wines, 
iced beverages, desserts . .  . 
at once-a-year savings!

Something
Special

272-4933 MULESHOE  2 2 2  MAIN

Price
Starts Monday, June 28

9:30 a.m.
Large Selection Of Merchandise In A ll Sizes !

Littlefield

Married In Double Ring Ceremony

the answer is p f  
simply... DO-NOTHING
J * a n s  i» y  SED G EFIELD

MRS. ROBERT BRUCE BRUNS

Liberty Belles Go To Anthony’s
The "Liberty Belles" sewing 

group of the Mulcshoe 4-H club 
had their first meeting, Mon­
day, June 14, in the home of 
their leader, Mrs. Walter Sain.
They discussed the two basic 

types of buttons and then prac­
ticed sewing on them.
They also discussed "Personal 

Appearance" and how to care

for their clothes and shoes. 
Refreshments were served to 
Jana Grumbles, Shelley Sain, 
Clinton Knowles and Dovic 
Knowles, assistant leader.

For their second meeting on 
Tuesday. June 15. the group 
met in the Sain home. They all 
drove to Anthony’s Department 
Store and read various labels on

fabric bolts, checked labels and 
hang tags for information. Lat­
er, they discussed the meaning 
of each. The group returned to 
the Sain home where thev did a
work sheet about "Places To
Shop".

Refreshments were served to
Jana Grumbles, Clinton Know­
les, Dovie Knowles, assistant 
leader and Shelley Sain.

In a double ring ceremony, 
Connie Lee Griffin and Robert 
Bruce Bruns were united in 
marriage in the Trinity Baptist 
Church of Muleshoe on Satur­
day. June 19, 1976 at 7:00 p.m. 
Rev. David Evetts performed 
the ceremony. Parents of the 
bride are Horton Griffin and the 
late Pauline Griffin. Parents of 
the groom are Mr. and Mrs.
L.F. Bruns, all of Mulcshoe. 
Mrs. Imogcne Tiller was coordi­
nator for her neice’s wedding. 
The bride, presented in mar­

riage by her father, wore a 
formal length gown of white 
organza, fashioned with a deep 
V neckline, edged with Venise 
lace and a flare ruffle edged 
with narrow lace. The ruffle 
formed a short cap sleeve.
The A-line skirt extended into 

a full length chapel train flowing 
from the empire bodice. A deep 
ruffle formed the hemline of the 
skirt and train. Heavy venise 
lace motifs accented the empire 
bodice and the A-line skirt. The 
headpiece was a juliet cap of 
venise lace holding a lace edged 
veil of illusion.

Miss Griffin carried a nosegay 
of pink bridal rose, stephanotis, 
white carnations and baby's 
breath, accented with white lace 
and long white streamers.
The couple pledged their vows 

in a candlelight setting, with a 
15 candelabra tier flanked by 
spiral candelabra, offset by a 
touch of green in two ferns on 
their choir railing, accented by 
large pink bows.
A memory candle on the pulpit 

railing was accented by deep 
rose tapers, carrying out the 
bride's chosen colors of shades 
of pink.

Maid of Honor was Tanya 
James of Muleshoe. Brides­
maids were Vicki Griffin, sister 
of the bride, and Cynthia Issac 
of Muleshoe.
The Maid of Honor wore a 

formal length dress of light pink 
dotted swiss, with double cape 
sleeves, a V neckline and wore a 
light pink flower headpiece. She 
carried a nosegay of all shades 
of pink, from burgandy to pale 
pink, accented with baby’s 
breath and long streamers. The 
bridesmaids wore dresses iden­
tical to that of the Maid of Honor 
in a darker shade of pink. They 
carried matching carnations, 
nosegay of pale pink, baby’s 
breath and long streamers.
The flower girl was Kristi 

Stephens, neice of the groom. 
She wore a dress identical to 
other attendants. She wore 
fresh flowers in her hair. Kristi 
carried a small basket, accented 
with pink bows, and streamers, 
with pink flower petals.

Ring bearer was Bryan Swint, 
cousin of the bride.
Groomsmen were Morris 

Bruns of North Aurora, Illinois 
and Jerry Bruns, Muleshoe. 
both brothers of the groom. Best 
Man was Mark Bruns, Mule­
shoe, brother of the groom. 
Candlelighters were Tammy 

Bruns, cousin ofnhe groom, and 
Janice Tiller, cousin of the 
bride. Ushers were Preston 
Wilson, Lubbock, and David 
Bray and Kenny Johnson of 
Muleshoe.

Mrs. Danny Curry, Plainview, 
served as pianist and sang the 
musical selections "We've Only

Just Begun” . "The Wedding 
Song" and "Wedding Prayer". 
For her neice’s wedding. Imo- 

gene Tiller wore a beige Quiana 
knit formal length gown with a 
draped neckline. Her corsage 
was a pink orchid.

Mrs. Bruns, mother of the 
groom wore a pink formal shirt 
waist gown of polyester. Her 
corsage was a pink orchid. 
Immediately following the ce­

remony, a reception was held in 
the home of the bride's father, 
Horton Griffin, 308 West Ave­
nue J.
The bride's table was laid with 

a white lace cut-work cloth over 
white satin. The bridal bouquet 
highlighted the table decora­
tions of pink and white daisies, 
centered with pink taper can­
dles. A four-tier wedding cake 
was served with banana punch, 
mints and nuts. Serving at the 
bride’s table were Kay Swint, 
cousin of the bride, Toni Pattie 
and Judy Watson, sisters of the 
groom.
The groom's table was laid 

with matching cloth. A two-tier­
ed strawberry cake was served 
with coffee, from a silver ser­
vice, belonging to the groom's 
grandmother, Mrs. Fred Bruns. 
Nuts and mints completed the 
service. Serving were Brenda 
Tiller, cousin of the bride and 
Jane Stephens, sister of the 
groom.

For her wedding trip, the bride 
chose a three piece blue poly­
ester knit pantsuit. Her acces­
sories were a seed pearl neck­
lace with matching earrings, gift 
of the groom and a pink orchid 
corsage. After a honeymoon trip 
to Ruidoso, New Mexico, the 
couple will be at home at 1710 
West Avenue B, Muleshoe.
The groom is employed by 

Watson Alfalfa and the bride is 
employed as receptionist for the 
same firm.

C igarettes, alcohol rated 
worst than pot for health.

MR. AND MRS. DARYL L. SPRABERRY 
* * * *

Have you read anything 
in the Bible lately?

Newlyweds Making 
Their Home In Tyler

.  . .  .  . n  .  .  _ m n it n  r n t i n  VMr. and Mrs. Daryl L. Spra­
berry are making their home in 
Tyler, after a wedding trip to 
Dallas.
The couple exchanged vows in 

The First Assembly of God 
Church in Muleshoe, Friday, 
June 11, with Rev. H.D. Hunt­
er, Jr. officiating.
The bride is the former Eliza­

beth Sue Tuttle of Clovis, N.M., 
and is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Art Tuttle of Bosque 
Farms, N.M. Parents of the 
bridegroom are Mrs. Dean 
Spraberry of Muleshoe, and 
Delbert Spraberry of Earth.
The bride wore a floor length 

gown of white quianta, fashion­
ed with long fitted sleeves, a 
high neckline and fitted bodice, 
complimented with seed pearls. 
Her fingertip veil was held by a 
draped cap of matching quianta, 
and set with seed pearls. She 
carried a cascade bouquet atop a 
red Bible, belonging to the 
groom's mother, set with steph- 
notis, red pixie carnations,white 
miniature carnations, and red 
roses accented with red and

HOFFMAN
HOUSE

OLD
WILLIAMSBURG

white satin.
The candlelight ceremony was 

held in the Sanctuary of the 
church. The kneeling bench was 
flanked by four seven-stem can­
delabra forming the background 
for the wedding party. Gypso- 
philia and other greenery decor­
ated the candelabra, and red 
and white carnations and red 
streamers complimented the 
planters on either side of the 
wedding party.
Prenuptial wedding music and 

traditional wedding marches 
were Mrs. W.T. Watson, on the 
organ. Selections included 
"Whither Thou Goest” , as the 
mothers were seated, and “ 1 
Love Thee” , by Grieg for the 
lighting of the candles. Attend­
ants marched in to the strains of 
"Trumpet Tune", by Purcell. 
Feature selections included 
"The Wedding Song” , sung by 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayland Ethridge 
before the ceremony and "The 
Wedding Prayer” by soloist.
M.D. Gunstream, which was 
sung just preceding the pastoral 
prayer.

Mrs. Dorothy Joe Sanchez of 
New York City, sister of the 
bride, attended as Matron of 
Honor. Bridesmaids were Mrs. 
Terri Blythe of Albuquerque 
and Miss Betty Johnson of 
Hastings. Nebraska, Their floor 
length gowns were of red boucle 
crepe with stand up collars, 
accented with white lace at the 
neckline and shoulders. Each 
attendant carried a long stem 
white rose, set with stephnotis 
and white satin.
J.W. Maritt, of Lazbuddie. 

uncle of the groom, was best 
man. Groomsmen were Kevin 
Tucker and C.L. Myers, both of 
Muleshoe. Ushers were Robert 
Sneed and Thurman Myers, 
both of Mulcshoe, and Don 
Dillard, of Roaring Springs. 
Lighting the candles were Ro­
bert Sneed and Don Dillard

cousin of the groom.
The groom wore a black and 

white tuxedo while the grooms­
men wore black tux with white 
shirts. Ushers were attired in 
black tux with red shirts.

A reception honoring the cou­
ple was held immediately fol­
lowing the ceremony at the 
Fellowship Hall of the Church, 
which was decorated throughout 
with the bride's chosen colors.

Shelley Dillard presided at 
the gift register, and Mrs. Mac 
Brown registered guests. Miss 
Toni Dillard, Miss Karen Gar­
ner and Mrs. Pat Mileshosky 
served wedding cake and punch 
to the guests. The table was laid 
with a white satin cloth, overlaid 
with white lace and accented by 
red satin streamers. The silver 
candelabra held the centerpiece 
of pixie carnations in red and 
white, red roses and white 
carnations with red candles and 
English Ivy. A Sterling Silver 
punch bowl and crystal appoint­
ments enhanced the setting. 
The wedding cake, of the bride 
and groom, was designed ajtd 
baked by Mrs. Arnis Morris. In 
traditional white, it was decorat­
ed with wedding bells and red 
roses.
Other members of the House 

party included Mrs. H.D. Hunt­
er, Mrs. Ray Lynk, Mrs. Clayton 
Myers, Mrs. W.T. Watson. 
Mrs. Rowena Watson and Mrs. 
James Roy Jones.

For the wedding trip the bride 
chose a red. white and blue pant 
ensemble, with red accessories. 
The couple are at home in Tyler, 
where Spraberry is employed by 
the Texas State Banking Depart­
ment. Spraberry is a graduate of 
Muleshoe High School and at­
tended West Texas State Uni­
versity. Previous to moving to 
Tyler, he was employed by The 
First National Bank of Muleshoe 
and Muleshoe Livestock Auc-

* t



A Straw
"Now. Harry.”  asked the 

teacher, " to  what family 
does the whale belong’ ”

” 1 don’t know.”  replied 
Harry. "Nobody in our 
neighborhood has one.”

MRS. WILLIAM GAIL MORRIS

TOPS Members
TOPS recognized their weekly 

i queen Thursday night. Queen of

Who loves his country can­
not hate mankind.

-Charles Churchill.

Receive Charms
the Week was Mrs. Wayland 
Harris, first runner-up was San­
dra Martin and second was Mrs.

MULESHOE MOTOR COMPANY
and

TOWN & COUNTRY AUTO
Jointly Announce They 

Will
Be Closed Saturdays 

Beginning
June 26th

Ronnie Garner.
Kay Griswold was the winner 

of the last contest. She was 
presented with a gift for her 
winnings. Those receiving 
charms were Mrs. Luis Mata. 
Mrs. Bura Vinson, Sandra Mar­
tin and Mrs. Owen Jones.

Mrs. J.O. Parker was in charge 
of the meeting. Ruth Miller read 
the minutes of the last meeting 
in absence of Mrs. Owen Jones. 
There were 17 members to 
weigh in, Thursday.

Next week, the six month 
queen will be recognized. Ev­
eryone is urged to bring a gift 
for her. Also, the monthly queen 
will be recognized, the first 
Thursday of the month. Mem­
bers are urged to bring fruit 
baskets to honor her with.

Miss Mote, Morris 
Solemnize Vows
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Miss Marcia Ann Mote and 
William Gail Morris were united 
in marriage at 8:00 p.m., Satur­
day, June 26, in the Sanctuary 
of the First United Methodist 
Church at Floydada.

Rev. Kenneth Rodgers, uncle 
of the bride, pastor of First 
United Methodist Church of 
Torrington. Connecticut, read 
the ceremony.
The bride is the daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert M. Mote, 
of Plainview. The groom is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Alton 
Morris, of Lazbuddie.
The altar setting was decorated 

with two large bouquets of 
spring flowers. The altar area 
was accented by natural sprays 
of emerald greenery, flanked by 
six candleabras and a centered 
memory candle, all adorned in 
natural greenery. Special pews 
were decorated with cascading 
greenery, topped by rainbow 
ribbon.

Mrs. John W. King of Canyon 
provided music at the organ and 
was accompanied by soloist 
Melissa Mote, sister of the 
bride. She sang a duet with 
Kenny Melton. They were ac­
companied by Blair Wilson on 
the guitar. They are all from 
Plainview.
Escorted to the altar and 

presented in marriage by her 
father, the bride approached the 
altar wearing a gown of candle­
light point d'gaze lace. It was 
designed in a princess silhouet­
te style with a portrait scoop 
neckline, emphasized by short 
capped sleeves. Bordering the 
hemline were deep scallops of 
matching lace, which swept into 
a full chapel train.
The bride wore a wide brim­

med picture hat completely 
covered in candlelight point 
d'graze lace. It was enhanced by 
French veiling around the band, 
falling over the back brim. It 
was adorned in the back with a 
fresh peonie.
The bride carried a natural 

cluster of assorted spring flow­
ers.

Mrs. Zoe Simpson of Houston 
was Matron of Honor. Miss 
Melissa Mote, sister of the 
bride, of Plainview was maid of 
honor. Bridesmaids were Mrs. 
Dave Scott, of Dallas; Miss 
Brenda Jones, Miss Jeannie 
Capps, and Miss Terri Lealos, 
all of Lubbock; and Miss Mari­
lyn Parks, of San Marcos.
The attendants wore a rainbow 

hued evening length gowns of 
Champagne satin. The gowns 
were wrapped dresses, with a 
semi-fitted bodice gathered at 
the front, into pointed forward 
shoulder seams, and at back 
into waistline. Partial circular 
skirt is accented with a bias sash 
which wraps and ties at side 
front. Each wore a satin ribbon 
tied in a bow around their neck, 
with a fresh flower compliment­
ing their dress color, attached in 
the back.

Each attendant carred a small 
cluster of assorted spring flow­
ers similar to that of the bride. 

Serving as best man was 
Monte Barnes of Canyon. 
Groomsmen were Jerry Mat­
thews of Dimmitt; Danny Parish 
of Springlake; Gary Matthews, 
of Arlington, brother-in-law of 
the groom; Dennis Baker, of 
Midland and Darrell Matthews 
and Bobby Redwine. both of 
Lazbuddie. Ushers were Daniel 
Morris, cousin of the groom, of 
San Antonio; Bobby Morris, 
cousin of the groom, of Amaril­
lo; Robert Carter, of Plainview 
and John D. Carter, of Houston,

C o n t a g i o u s

"1 hear they’re starting 
a new campaign against 
m alaria.”

"D ear me! What have the 
Malarians done now?"

both cousins of the bride.
Miss Miranda Northrup, El 

Paso, cousin of the bride, was 
flower girl. Curtis Matthew of 
Arlington, nephew of the groom 
was ring bearer. Robert Carter 
of Plainview and John D. Car­
ter of Houston, both cousins of 
the bride, lighted the candles.

Miss Carole Majoi, Killeen 
and Miss Betsey Douglas, of 
Dallas registered the guests.
Following the ceremony, the 

couple greeted guests at a 
reception at the Parlor of the 
First United Methodist Church.
The bride's table was decorat­

ed with spring bouquets.
Hostesses at the reception 

were Mrs. John C. Carter, and 
Mrs. John R. Hunter, both 
aunts of the bride; Mrs. Byron 
Bennett, and Mrs. Sidney Rod­
gers, aunt of the bride, and 
Miss Dixie McFarland and Miss 
Sue Stewart, both of Garland.
Those serving at the groom’s 

table were Mrs. Gary Matthews 
of Arlington, sister of the 
groom; and Mrs. David Hill, of 
Clovis, N.M., sister of the 
groom; Mrs. Ted Noel, Plain- 
view, and Mrs. Mike Miller, 
Mrs. Johnny Estes, Mrs. Rod 
Schoppa, all of Lubbock.
Others assisting at the house 

party were Mrs. Eddie Lewel- 
len, Mrs. Ed Stanford, Mrs. 
Roland Zeigler, Jr., Mrs. J.B. 
Roberts, Mrs. Grady Tunnell 
and Mrs. Gred Robertson.

For a wedding trip, the couple 
plans to go to the Bahamas, and 
to visit Nassau and Freeport.
The new bride has attended 

Stephen F. Austin State Univer­
sity and is a Texas Tech 
graduate, as of May, 1976. She 
graduated with a B.S. in Home 
Economics Ed. The groom at­

tended Texas Tech and gradu­
ated in December of 1974, with 
a B.S. in Agriculture. The bride 
was a member of Delta, Delta, 
Delta Social Sorority. She will be 
employed by Lazbuddie School, 
teaching Secondary Home Eco­
nomics. The groom is engaged 
in farming.
Out-of-town guests were Mr. 

and Mrs. John R. Hunter, aunt 
and uncle of the bride; Mr. and 
Mrs. Russell Judd and Bobby, 
all of Lorena. cousins of the 
bride; and Mr. and Mrs. Mac 
Collins of Morehead City, N.C. 
and Mr. and Mrs. E.A. Olson, 
of Houston, both aunts and 
uncles of the bride.
The rehearsal party and 

bridesmaids luncheon were held 
at Far East Restaurant Friday, 
June 2$. Grooms parents were 
hosts. A bridesmaid luncheon 
was held in Lubbock in the Pink 
Room at The Alhambra, at 
noon, on Friday, the 25. Host­
esses were Mrs. Bob Lemon, 
Mrs. Rodney Schoppa, of Lub­
bock and Mrs. Gene McMaster 
of Waco.

Pre-nuptial courtesies honor­
ing the bride were held on 
Saturday, June 19, in the home 
of Mrs. J.W. King, Jr. with 
Mrs. H.M. Hamilton as co-host­
ess. The bride was feted with a 
ricebag coffee. The guests tied 
rice bags.

Handing out wedding pro­
grams at the wedding were Mrs. 
Eddie Huffhine of Hale Center 
and Mrs. Erwin Blackerby, of 
Kress.
Distributing rice bags at the 

reception was Miss Sonya Stan­
ford.
The couple will make their 

home at Lazbuddie. They will be 
home Sunday, July 4, 1976.

Golden Anniversary 
Honors Pattersons

On June 13, 1927 at 9:00 a.m. 
friends and relatives gathered in 
the yard of the H.J. Mince 
home, to witness the marriage 
of Grace Mince and Ves Patter­
son. The house guests consisted 
of relatives and friends of both 
parties.
Lunch was served for all. 

Music, singing and laughter 
was the order of the day. Later 
in the afternoon a select group 
from the party drove the bride 
and groom to Waco to catch a 
train to Temple, and thence to 
Lubbock and Sudan. A part of 
the way the train or coach was 
pulled by a freight train. They 
arrived in Sudan the next day, 
without a place arranged for 
them to stay. Thus they entered 
Sudan where they were destined 
to spend their wedded lives. 
The Treba Phillips, friends of 

the groom provided the first 
night's lodging. Both being 
from Christian homes, they 
were baptized in August of 1926 
in the old Preston tank just 
outside of town. They became 
members of the First Baptist 
Church, where their member­
ship remains. Eight years later a 
daughter was born. She was 
their only child. She lived her 
early years in Sudan. She began 
and completed her public school 
education, there and also be­
came a member of the First 
Baptist Church. Their daughter 
took part in other activities also.

Mr. and Mrs. Patterson work­
ed together through the years 
and retired in January of 1967. 
For the past several years 
they’ve gone to the Texas coast 
in October where they stay until 
May. They are ardent ‘‘fishers" 
of fish and many around them 
profit by their “ catches".
The time thev now spend in 

Sudan is divided. From Monday 
through Friday, the spend their 
time in Logan. N.M. at their

COUPLE PLANS AUGUST WEDDING . .  Mr. and Mrs. Charles R.
Glass formerly of Muleshoe, now residing in Snyder announce the 
engagement and approaching marriage of their daughter, Barbara 
Marie, to Ronnie Joe Myers, son of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Myers, of 
Farwell. Barbara is a 1976 graduate of Muleshoe High School. The 
couple plans to exchange vows August 20 at 3:00 p.m.. in the home 
of her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bob Glass of Snyder.

("reamers Attend Davidson 
Cousin Reunion, Tuesday

they are home in Sudan.
On June 13. 1976, Fredda and 

her family hosted the 50 wed­
ding anniversary celebration for 
her parents. The house consist­
ed of Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Hays, 
daughter and husband of Aus­
tin: an only grandson and wife, 
Mr. and Mr9. Tim Gage, of 
Houston; two granddaughters, 
Tracy and Tanya Hays of Aus­
tin; a brother to Mrs. Patterson, 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Mince of 
Dallas; and her sister, Miss 
Ruby Minde of Sudan. Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Patterson, his bro­
ther, were unable to be here due 
to illness in the family.
Their grandson and his wife 

provided the centerpiece of 
flowers on the punch tables. The 
granddaughters gave the cor­
sages and the boutonniere. 
Fredda provided the cake, and 
was in charge of the celebration 
activities.
The only two members attend­

ing in 1976 and also at their first 
house party in 1926 was Fred 
Mince of Dallas and Ruby Mince 
of Sudan; a brother and sister of 
Mrs. Patterson.
Open house for friends and 

acquaintances began Sunday 
afternoon at 3:00 p.m. and 
continued until 5 p.m. A small 
receiving line consisting of Mr. 
and Mrs. Patterson. Mr. and 
Mrs. Hays and Tim Gage greet­
ed those who came to congratu­
late them on their wedding 
anniversary.
Tanya Hays registered the 

guests. Tracy Hays served 
punch and Mrs. Tim Gage 
served the cake. Mrs. Marion 
Mince, Mrs. Gwen West and 
Mrs. Rubilee Walser kept the 
punch and cups out. They are 
sister-in-law and friends of the 
honorees. They all wish to take 
this means of expressing their 
gratitude to all those who came; 
to those who couldn't come, but

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Creamer 
were among several Davidson 
family cousins who attended a 
reunion in Levelland last Tues­
day.

Accompanying Mr. and Mrs. 
Creamer to Levelland were her 
sister and husband, Mr. and 
Mrs. Andrew Carroll of Padu­
cah, w ho had been house guests 
in the Creamer home for several 
days.

Mrs. Creamer and Mrs. Carroll 
are daughters of the late Mr. 
and Mrs. Tommy Davidson. 
Meeting in the Mamie Scoggin 

home in Levelland were Mrs. 
Scoggin. Merle Thomas of Le­
velland, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Fox 
of San Francisco, Calif, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bud Taylor of Roswell,
N.M. They are children of the 
late Charlie Davidson.

Children of the late Morgan 
Davidson at the reunion were 
Lillie Baugh, Noma Davidson 
and Lola Mae Young, all of 
Lubbock.

Also attending the reunion 
were children of Mrs. Scoggin, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Scoggin

Best Of Press
Near

Election year is when 
the nearest thing to the 
jawbone of an ass may be 
a microphone.

-Wall Street Journal.

Definition
Backward civilization: 

One where the people have 
to make out with the orig­
inal articles, not being 
able to afford synthetic 
substitutes.

-Pilot, Brunswick, Ga.

and Velma Bartow, of Level- 
land.

It was the first time many of 
the family members had seen 
each other in more than 50 
years. Following visiting with 
cousins and meeting some fami­
ly members who had been 
added to the Davidson family, 
all those who met for the 
reunion had lunch at the Spot 
restaurant in Levelland.

steri V s t e a m
CARPET CLEANING

Commerciol • 

Residential

VALUABLE CARPETING in
your home? We increase the 
life of your carpeting by 
removing the dirt, grease and 
residues left by ALL other 
cleaning methods. Call us for 
a thorough cleaning by STERI- 
STEAM. Ph. 806/238-1640. 
THOMAS CARPET CLEAN­
ING SERVICE. BOVINA. 
TFXAS.

COUNTRY COBBLER
Boot & Shoo Repair Shop

118 E. A ve. B 
Muleshoe

Dwayne Gable
Mgr.

Air conditioning?
D on’t just m elt away.

Breeze over to the Yellow Pages, and  
find w here to get the cool of your d ream s.

For anyth ing  at a ll— it's  there  at your fing ertips  
when your fingers do th e  w alking  

through the Yellow Pages.

yellow pages
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Lazbuddie Celebrates

HOME FOB CELEBRATION . .  . Looking i t  photos from days gone 
by in the Lazbuddie schools are from left. Maudine Barnes.
Buchanan, Paducah, Ky.; Mrs. Perry Barnes, Lazbuddie and 
Wynell Barnes White of Elizabethton. Tenn.

In 1907, the Lazbuddie school started as the “ Star Ranch School" 
with one teacher and seven students, and was named for a dominant 
ranch in the area at that time. Today, Lazbuddie has grown, and the 
school has progressed to a very modern facility with up-to-date 
buildings and numerous teachers to serve the community.

Last Saturday, Lazbuddie celebrated 50 years of groth with 
hundreds of community individuals and exes traveling home for a 
couple of days of "remembering" More than 700 people registered 
during the two days set aside for the celebration.

F.A. Cook, the first teacher at Lazbuddie, lived in a tent for two 
years in the community and moonlighted as a county surveyor. For a 
few years, the school "traveled around, looking for a home” in an 
attempt to place the school as near as possible in the center of the 
students who were attending the school.

Lazbuddie didn't show up until 1925, when the school consolidated 
with the Castro County school district Red Tower and combined the 
names of two men Lazarus Green and Buddy Sherley to come up the 
name of Lazbuddie.

Early days at the school, during the years from around 1925-1926, 
students numbered around 70 with three teachers. Utilized as desks 
and seats were bricks and nail kegs, with few books being available.

From 1927, when a brick building was constructed, the school 
began to maintain steady growth with the school becoming fully 
accredited for high school students by 1928, and in 1929, the home 
economics and vocational departments were added.

Anniversary activities got underway on Saturday with a reception 
in the school cafeteria. An afternoon of visiting had old friends 
looking over full collections of pictures from 1926-1976 displayed in 
the school cafeteria. All of Lazbuddie's yearbooks, as well as 
personal scrapbooks and newspaper clippings were in display. Also 
on exhibit were more than 800 arts and crafts exhibited by local 
artists.
The evening was completed with a volleyball tournament in tne 

school gym. Oldest class to participate was the class of 1945. First 
place trophies were presented to Jan (Nowell) Adams; Joyce 
(Hudson) McGehee; Louise (Routon) Engteking; Marilyn (Barnes) 
Hinkson; Frank Hinkson; Hoppy Jennings and Ronny Barnes.
This team represented the classes of 1965, 1966 and 1969. Second 

place trophies went to Beverly (Smith) Adkins. Coretta Watkins, 
Ronald Elliott, Jerry Don Glover, Wayne Peterson and John 
Sullivan. This team represented the class of 1961. A concession 
stand was utilized for supper, complete with home made pie and ice 
cream.
On Sunday, a barbecue dinner was hosted for more than 550 

people before going to the auditorium for the afternoon program. 
Jerry Don Glover was master of ceremonies and Kent Winders, 
president of the Student Council, gave the invocation followed by 
the pledge of allegiance and national anthem led by Glenda 
Jennings. Glover welcomed the overflowing crowd and thanked the 
Lazbuddie Young Homemakers for coordinating the celebration. 
Each class was asked to stand and be recognized, as well as past 
and present faculty members of the school.

D.B. Ivy gave the background information on the school and the 
community and Mrs. Neely Moore and Scotty Windham presented a 
rundown on the outstanding athletic, agricultural and academic 
achievements of the school during its lifetime. It was noted that 
Lazbuddie's 1961 track team was the first track team in the 
Panhandle to ever win the state team title and the first athletic team 
of any kind in Parmer County to ever win state honors. Also 
included was Lazbuddie's 15 year winning streak in the Parmer 
County Fat Stock Show. Many other Bi-District, Regional, and State 
honors were also mentioned.

Marilyn Hinkson and Charlotte Redwine, representing the Young 
Homemakers presented special awards and recognitions.
Receiving gifts as being from Lazbuddie's first graduating class in 

1931 were Mrs. Juanita (Ivy) Garrett, Las Cruces, N.M.; Mrs. 
Pauline (Seaton) Green, Lazbuddie; and Robert Prather, Coleman. 
A presentation to the person who traveled the greatest distance for 

the reunion was received by Mrs. Lois (Freeman) Voyles of Shingle 
Springs, Calif. Others traveling from great distances included 
Odessa (Miller) Whisenhunt, Murt and John Sullivan. Mildred 
(Vincent) McAllister and Sherri, all from Fresno, Calif.; Reba Hunt 
from Govis, Calif.; Dora Lou (Hayhurst) Madson, Columbia. Ind.; 
Hac McCurdy, Pocatello, Ida.; Wynell (Barnes) White, Johnson 
City, Tenn.; and Maudine (Barnes) Buchanan, Paducah, Ky. 
Guests were also registered from the states of Colorado, Arizona. 

Oklahoma and New Mexico.
Teachers who had spent the longest number of years in the 

Lazbuddie classrooms were also honored. Miss Grace Paul, 
deceased, had devoted 24 years to the Star Ranch and Lazbuddie 
School. Her sister, also a former teacher at Lazbuddie, Miss Greta 
Paul, was present and was recognized.
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Wilbanks were presented a gift of appreciation 

for devoting 21 years to the students and school system at 
Lazbuddie. Mr. and Mrs. Glen Scott were next honored for having a 
child in the Lazbuddie Schools continually for 31 years.

Door prizes were presented Frank Jesko, Janice (Darling) 
Thompson, Eugene Redwine and Charletta Treider. Mrs. Treider 
received a Lillian Smith painting. Other awards and gifts were 
presented by North Lazbuddie Gin. Farmer's Spraying Service. 
Lazbuddie Chemical, Lazbuddie Farmer's Co-op. Lazbuddie Garage 
and Supply, Sherley-Anderson, Foster Fertilizer, Maritt Grocery. 
Treider Electric and Clay’s Corner Grocery.

Mrs. Glenda Jennings gave a Bicentennial Salute followed by a 
moment of silent prayer for the country and everyone then sang 
"God Bless America." The reunion closed with the Lazbuddie 
cheerleaders Karen Scott, Candy Moore. Tammy Smith and Angela 
Matthews leading the group in the school song.
A Lazbuddie spokesman commented. "The Lazbuddie Young 

Homemakers should be commended on a job well done." and in 
turn, the Young Homemakers said they wish to thank the 
community and guests for their enthusiasm and help in making this 
birthday for the school and community a tremendous success.

AT THE SERVING TABLE . . . Right in line around the serving
table are from left, Lisa McGehee, Joyce McGehee, serving and 
Quinn Adkins.

BOOSTING PIONEERS . . .  In the Pioneer at Lazbuddie during the
weekend were Mr. and Mrs. Otho Whitfield. They were boosting
the Pioneer spirit of the community and soliciting family histories.
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Industrial Commission SeeksFiber Industry
Bailey County Journal, Sunday June 27, IV76, Foge 7

Although Texas leads the na­
tion in production of cotton, 
wool and mohair, and is the 
leading supplier of feedstock for 
production of synthetic fiber, 
only one and a half percent of 
the fabric produced in the 
United States is woven in Texas.
"W e're here to do something 

about that," according to Jim 
Heath of the Special Projects 
Division of the Texas Industrial 
Commission.
Heath is special advisor to the 

Joint House Committee on Tex­
tile Industry Development creat­
ed by the 64th state legislature.

"Our current goals are to 
determine what areas of the 
state, besides the High Plains, 
are suited to textile milling and 
how to bring the textile mills to 
Texas," Heath said.

"This includes identifying tex­
tile specialty items to be produc­
ed in rural areas. This is more 
than just dreaming up cute 
items. We're talking about in- 
depth research into cost input 
and benefit return ratio to help 
industrial development groups 
and investors put these ideas 
into action.”

Most of the textile milling in 
the nation is in the Southeastern 
states. Their process uses Texas 
raw products, and their raw 
cloth is then shipped back to one 
of Texas’ more than 700 gar­
ment manufacturing plants.

"We want to eliminate the 
middle-man in the process,” 
Heath said. "We want to make 
it feasible and enticing to in­
vestors to set up textile mills in 
Texas where the costs of trans­
portation would be drastically 
reduced, and the cost to the 
cij.stomcr of the finished gar-

metn would be lower.”
The textile committee has 

spent the last several months 
acquainting themselves with the 
textile industry resources and 
processes in Texas, and is now 
in the stage of gathering data to 
outline a specific program to 
expand this industry.
The committee is co-chaired by 

Rep. E.L. Short of Tahoka and 
Armer Harwood, president of 
the Texas Sheef and Coat 
Raisers Association. Sen. Grant 
Jones of Abilene is vice-chair­
man.
Other members are Sen. Kent 

Ha nee of Lubbick, Sen, Tom 
Creighton of Mineral Wells, 
Rep. Forrest Green of Corsicana 
and Rep. Don Rains of San 
Marcos. Governor Dolph Bris­
coe appointed Dan Davis of the 
Plains Cotton Cooperative Asso­
ciation in Lubbock and Fred 
Walker of the Walker Estate 
Ranch in Comstock.

They are being assisted by 
Heath and Carl Cox, executive 
director of the Natural Fibers 
and Food Protein Commission; 
Bill Harris, director of the 
Natural Fibers Economic Re­
search Department of The Uni­
versity of Texas at Austin; Dr. 
Herb Grubb of the Governor's 
Division of Planning Coordina­
tion; and Marvin Segal, director 
of the Southwest Apparel Manu­
facturers Association based in 
Dallas.

"The committee is not starting 
from scratch in their study," 
Heath noted. "The Industrial 
Commission has been working 
on the concept of strengthening 
the textile industry in Texas for 
more than five years, and two 
reports have been published by 
the Commission in conjunction 
with two interim legislative 
committees.”
One of the studies, "Report on 

the Feasibility of Textile Pro-

Beef: A Part Of 
A m ericas History

T a l l  w it h  c A rrtp n n p  n h n n t  fu rt i . ®Talk with someone about typi 
cal American dishes and odds 
are you'll find yourself discus­
sing beef. Beef is an important 
element in American cuisine 
and has been since America's 
birth 200 years ago ... an even 
before that.
Cattle first came to the Ameri­

can Southwest with the Spanish 
in the !500's and in 1624 with 
English settlers in New En­
gland. For early Americans 
cattle were an important food 
source; but in the chain of uses 
for cattle, meat was last. Cattle

Safe Boating Over The Fourth 
Means Freedom From 
Accidents

The July 4 three-day weekend 
is sure to increase the traffic on 
Texas roads — and on our 
waterways. With boat owners 
numbering almost half a mil­
lion, Texas Safety Association, 
in recognition of Safe Boating 
Week, July 4-10. reminds boat­
ers to keep an eye out for each 
other.

Each year between 400 and 500 
Texans die in drowning acci-

MULESH0E LOCKER
Fed M ea t  Goats  

(Care Wt.App.40lbs . )

S0( Ik.
Fed  Mutton (Sheep) 

(Care  Wf. App.
60 lbs.)
5 0 <  lb .

"C abrito "  
(Care Wt. App .

15 lbs.)

$ 1 7 .5 0  p * r .  b d .  

ALSO  
" B  o rnate"  

USDA Inspected

Muleshoe 
Locker

40? Main 
272-4703

dents, mainly during holiday 
periods. To assure that your 
holiday is free from injury, keep 
in mind these boating safety
tips:

* Check to see that your boat 
and trailer are in tip-top shape 
before leaving home.

* Always have sufficient life 
preservers accessible to every­
one on board.

* Carry filled fire extinguishers 
-• and use caution when filling 
fuel tanks.

* Remember that the rules for 
safe driving apply on the water, 
too. Hot rodding and drinking 
while boating are taboo!

Water safety rules also apply 
to fishermen, swimmers and 
water-skiers who will be enjoy­
ing the water along with boat­
ers. Waterskiers, in particular, 
should remember to confine 
their skiing to areas where there 
is no swimming or skin diving; 
to wear approved life jackets; 
and, to exercise caution. Exces­
sive speed and sudden contact 
with obstacles in unfamiliar 
channels can end the holiday in 
grief.
Texas Safety Association joins 

with the Texas Parks and Wild­
life Department and U.S. Coast 
Guard Auxiliary in asking Tex­
ans to observe Safe Boating 
Week, July 4-10 — and to 
continue the spirit of safe boat­
ing the whole year 'round.

Some 7.8 million veterans 
trained under the World War II 
Gl Bill, the Veterans Admini­
stration reported.

*  • • *  *
The Veterans Administration 

has guaranteed about 5.8 mil­
lion home loans to World War II 
veterans.

were, first, work animals; se­
cond, a source of milk; third, a 
source of hides; and lastly, 
meat.
Today, by-products are still 

valued but beef cattle are first a 
source of nutritious, versatile 
and tasty beef. The beef indus­
try has improved cattle breeds, 
production methods, handling 
and transporation to the point 
where today's cook is guaran­
teed of the finest beef in the 
world. American beef is the 
world's standard for taste and 
tenderness. No wonder beef is 
America's favorite meat.
Beef recipes were originally 

passed from cook to cook, 
generation to generation, by 
word of mouth. The first cook­
book to appear in America was 
published in 1742. Called "The 
Compleat Housewife” it was 
edited from an earlier English 
work by E. Smith. The first truly 
American cookbook, called "A- 
merican Cookery” , was written 
and published in Connecticut in 
17% by Amelia Simmons. It was 
designed by the writer, herself 
an orphan, to help guide fellow 
orphans who had no one to teach 
them the skills of cooking.
Then, as now, beef was an 

important part of any cookbook. 
And recipes such as Colonial 
Steak and Kidney Pie or Beef 
Wellington have been preserved 
and improved upon for genera­
tions.

"The Bicentennial Beef Cook­
book" published by the Beef 
Industry Council of the Meat 
Board features 100 of the best 
beef recipes from America's 
first 200 years. Colonial kitchen 
favorites to the early West's 
chuckwagon greats, Pilgrim's 
Pot Roast to Planked Porter­
house Steak and Beef Jerky to 
High-Rise Hamburgers, Ameri­
ca's rich heritage of beef cook­
ery is captured in this 128-page 
book. It also incudes fascinating 
historical information and help­
ful sections on cookery methods, 
storing of beef, carving and 
much, much more. The cook­
book is available by mail only. 
Send $2 (check or money order) 
to Bicentennial Beef Cookbook, 
Beef Industry Council, Dept. 76, 
444 N. Michigan Ave., Chicago, 
Illinois, 60611.

House okays bill to fund 
new jobs.

Defense ftmds measure, 
$112.3 billion signed.

duction on the Texas High 
Plains" has resulted in tht 
creation of the American Cotton 
Growers Denim Mill which has 
just begun production of denim 
for the Levi Strauss Co.

"This $30 million plant, locat­
ed in Littlefield, is opening 
employment opportunities to 
more than 400 people. The 
impact on the community is 
fantastic,” Heath said.

“ We want this same kind of 
impact for other areas of the 
state.”

Heath says Texas' location, 
equidistant to both the East and 
West coasts and the Midwest, 
makes it ideal for transportation 
of finished goods to all the major 
markets. He cited the Dallas 
Apparel Mart's importance to 
fashion as one of the state’s 
existing footholds on the indus­
try.

"Texas has all the pieces to the 
puzzle but one,” Heath said. 
"Now the committee is docu­
menting all the reasons why 
Texas should become the major 
site for textile mills, and will 
present a final game plan to the 
Legislature in January.”

Heath said input is being 
sought from experts in every 
phase of the textile industry, 
and invites contributing infor­
mation from all people involved 
in the total production process 
from raising crops and herds 
and oil products, to marketing 
the final product.

Information should be sent to 
Jim Heath, Texas Industrial 
Commissin, P.O. Box 12728, 
Capitol Station, Austin, Texas 
78711.

THP Patrof To 
Intensify For 
Holiday

The director of the Texas 
Department of Public Safety 
said today indications are that 
some 42 persons will be killed in 
Texas traffic accidents during 
the Fourth of July weekend, and 
called upon Texas drivers to 
"prove our estimate is too 
high.”
Colonel Wilson E. Speir said 

his department expects "unusu­
ally heavy traffic” throughout 
the state, especially around 
recreational areas and where 
Bicentennial celebrations are 
scheduled.

He said the estimate covers a 
78-hour period which starts at 6 
p.m. Friday and continues until 
midnight Monday, July 5.

During a comparable period 
last year, the department esti­
mated that 54 persons would be 
killed during the holiday period. 
At the conclusion of the July 4 
holiday last year, statewide 
statistics indicated 44 lives lost 
and rose to 49 with late reports.

In a concerted effort to kep 
deaths down, the DPS and local 
law enforcement agencies will 
be cooperating in an all-out 
effort to make the streets and 
highways as safe as possible. 
All available DPS troopers will 
be on duty, Speir indicated, and 
they will be especially watchful 
for drinking drivers, speeders 
and persons driving in a reck­
less manner.

In addition, the DPS will be 
working with the news media in 
|a special public education pro­
gram termed "Operation Mo- 
torcide” which focuses public 
attention on where and why 
fatal accidents are occurring 
during the holiday period.

v o u  c a n

B a m
o n  I t !

Bill Loyd, President 
Muleshoe State Bank

Money, as any other 
commodity, is a marketable 
item, and the price of that 
money is the interest you pay 
for it.

In te re s t ra tes, as bor­
row ers know, can fluctuate 
from month to month, even 
day to day. and are influenced 
by many factors.

Most authorities agree that 
long-term interest rates are 
influenced by expectations as 
to the future value of money 
itself, and many lenders who 
sec inflation ahead will not 
lend unless the return looks 
high enough to offset the use 
of the money and compensate 
for the probable decline in its 
value before the money is 
repaid.

Lending money is a 
business just as any other, 
and banks, as all businesses, 
expect to make a moderate 
profit. Ranks are in the 
business to lend money. They 
aren't, however, in business 
to  give it away without a 
reasonable return. They also 
have to ‘‘buy" money and pay 
interest for it.

It is this system of "buying 
and selling" that makes 
American banking one of the 
most stable in the world.

HE’S A WINNER . . . Casey Farmer is pictured with his first place
grade gelding, under five, which won top honors in its field during

the 12th annual District Horse Show at Lubbock last Tuesday. Casey
»”as the top winner from the Progress 4-H Club at the two-day show.

Moscow delays signing 
nuclear treaty.

biochs News
By M rs . J O. Bayless

Father’s Day guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. C.C. 
Snitker were Mr. and Mrs. J.C. 
Snitker and children, of Enochs; 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Gilber, of 
Sudan; and Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
Snitker and children, of Hart.• * * * *

Mrs. Kenneth Petree and 
daughter, Beckie, of Clovis, 
N.M. spent Thursday through 
Sunday with the Chester Pe- 
tree's. Other guests for Father's 
Day were their sons, Kenneth 
Petree and Mr. and Mrs. Dan­
nie Petree and children, of

Social Security hike be­
gins July 1.

Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Bayless 
were dinner guests in the home 
of her brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Coffman at Morton Sun­
day. Other guests were their 
children. Mr. and Mrs. David 
Coffman and daughter, Debbie, 
of Seagraves; and Mrs. David 
Trout, of Lubbock; Mrs. Willie 
Montgomery and children, of 
Lubbock; and Tom Coffman and 
daughters, of Plainview.

* * * * *
Sunday guests in the home of 

Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Layton 
Father's Day were her father, 
Carl Hall, of Enochs; and a 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Burris 
and sons, of Wellman.

* * * * *
Visitors at the Baptist Church 

Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Petree and Beckie of 
Clovis, N.M.; Jerry Sowder, of 
Bula; Matt Jonas and a friend.

Watchdog bill alterations 
rejected.

* * ***
from Germany; and Mr. and 
Mrs. Curtis Snitker and children 
of Hart.

* * * * *
Mrs. Ella Halford of Muleshoe 

visited in the community Mon­
day. She visited Mrs. E.N. 
McCall, Mrs. Winnie Byard and 
had dinner with Mrs. Alma

Carter calls for 5-year 
nuclear te s t ban.

Altman.
* * * * *

Mrs. Dean McBee returned 
home Thursday from a visit with 
her daughter. Mrs. Terry Spell 
at Chattanooga, Tenn. Her 
daughter returned home with 
her for a two week visit. 

* * * * *

HEARING AIDS 
CLOVIS HEARING AID CENTER

*  Batteries ★ Molds ★ Free Heating lasts
403 E 14th

SERVICE ALL HAKES
Ctovts. N.M. Pho 763-6900

The most important step towards saving money 
on heating and cooling costs is really inside a 
home...The Energy Efficient Home makes sure 
that heating and cooling stays inside your home, 
where it belongs. It's really not a new concept at 
all. With the days of cheap energy gone, it is 
important to use electricity more wisely than ever 
before. The energy Efficient Home is today's best 
method of enjoying clean, comfortable electric 
living at the lowest possible cost.

LOOK

WALLS conform to one of three options: # 0 N E -  
6" walls with R-19* insulation, #TW 0 - tongue 
and grooved styrofoam sheathing, 4" walls and 
R 11* insulation, or #THREE R 15* minimum 
insulation. Walls must include a vapor barrier of 
6 mil. polyethylene or foil backed sheetrock. Sill 
insulation or sill caulking (under bottom plate) is 
also required.

CEILING insulation must equal R-30*.

FLOORS (if pier and beam construction) must be 
insulated with R-13*. In slab floors choose be­
tween Option #1 . rigid urethane or styrofoam 
(3/4 minimum thickness) from top of floor along 
the outside edge of the s'ab down to the brick 
ledge, or Option # 2 . vermiculite poured in the 
cavity between bricks and slab up to the top of 
the floor.

WINDOWS AND DOORS are weather stripped and 
caulked. Double pane glass or storm windows 
and insulated core or storm doors also ensure 
energy efficiency. It is recommended that glass 
area not exceed 8% of floor space.

CQUM OPPORTUNITY [MP1 0 YEP

ASK FOR FREE NEW HOME 
PLANNING BROCHURE

OTHER RECOMMENDATIONS include the use of 
cool fluorescent lighting, a heating/cooling system 
like the heat pump that maximizes efficiency and 
an electronic air cleaner to be used with moving 
air systems.

Today there is no need to sacrifice comfort to 
save energy and money. The Energy Efficient 
Home - like everything else electric - is as modern 
as tomorrow. Call your Southwestern Public 
Service Company manager He'll give you all the 
details on the modern, comfortable way to save 
energy and money with the Energy Efficient Home.

’ The "R" value in the guidelines indicates the Installed Re 
sistance of the insulation to the flow of heat

ELI
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Sudan News
By Mrs. VNayno Doty

KIWANIS TRAILER REBUILT . . .  For the second time, the
Kiwanis trailer has been completely rebuilt and is ready for use. It 
was scavenged from a surface lake, and was blown away. It is now 
elegantly refinished and available to civic groups for worthwhile
projects.

IRS to probe slush fund 
activities.

Box y ields Abraham Lin­
coln memorabilia.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Morris and
boys of Grants, N.M. are visit­
ing here with his parents for an 
extended stay. They also attend­
ed the funeral services of his 
uncle, Shelby Morris.

*****
In the ladies Bible class, there 

were fourteen attending, on 
Wednesday, June 16 at the 
Sudan Church of Christ. The 
lesson "Overcoming Harsh 
Judgement and Faultfinding", 
taught by Art Lynch was com­
pleted.
Attending were Evelyn Fisher, 

Mae Fisher, Jane Wiseman, 
Kaye Wiseman, Bette Withrow, 
Wanda Swart, Larue West, Nell 
Ingle, Ethel Beale, Quinelle 
Pickrell, Opal McCaghren, Arta 
B. May, June Bartley and Edith 
Reed.

Singleton-Blis Funeral Home

24 Hou Ambdcnce Serwce 
fh 272-4574 . Mdeshoe

There will be a benefit barbe­
cue Saturday, June 26, at the 
community center from 7-9 p.m. 
It is for the Fire Department to 
raise money for a new fire truck. 
It will cost $25.00 per couple or 
$15.00 per person and $7.50 for

those under 12 years old. 
* * * * *

Miss Cindy Feagley, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Charles Feag­
ley, was honored Monday, June 
14 on her third birthday, with a 
party. Chocolate cake decorated 
in pink and punch were served 
to those attending. They were 
Leslie Scott, Jamie Gatewood, 
Spencer and Jonathan O’Rear, 
Michael and Leann Conley and 
the honoree’s brother, Richard. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Philip Gordan, 

Kay Lynn and Jeff returned 
home Monday from touring ten 
states during the past two 
weeks. They visited with his 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Gordon and son in Elizabeth­
town, Kentucky; and with 
friends in Aurora. Colorado. 
Other states they toured includ­
ed Arkansas, Tennessee, Iowa, 
Nebraska, Illinois, New Mexico 
and Texas. Accompanying them 
was her mother, Mrs. Vera 
Thomas, of Olney.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Earl 

Williamson and Dusty of Vernon 
visited over the weekend in the 
home of his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. D.W. Williamson. They all 
celebrated Dusty’s first birth­
day.

*****
Lt. and Mrs. Arboth Rvlant of

Oak Harbor, Washington, are 
parents of a boy, Mark Christo­
pher, born around noon, Tues­
day, June 22 in Whidbey Island 
Naval Air Station hospital. The 
infant weighed nine pounds, 
one ounce. Grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. G.C. Ritchie, of 
Sudan, and Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Rylant, of Perryton. Great 
grandfather is W.A. Rylant of 
Denver City.
The couple has two daughters, 

Kim, nine, and Tammi, six. 
Mrs. Rylant is the former An­
drea Ritchie.• * * * *

Sudan chapter No. 806 met 
Saturday, June 12, 1976 in the 
Sudan Masonic Lodge Hall for 
the ceremony installation for 
officers for 1976-77.
Officers for the year are Jean­

ne Gage, Worthy Matron; Jim 
Gage, Worthy Patron; Edith 
Humphrye, Associate Matron; 
Coleman Terrell, Associate Pa­
tron; Secretary, Oleta Reece; 
Treasurer, Sara Woods; Con­
ductress. Rosabel Coldiron; As­
sociate Conductress, Winona 
Dudgeon; Chaplain, Mildred 
Lance; Marshall, Mary Pearl 
Bellar; Organist, Viginia Rone; 
Ada, Willie Terrell; Esther, 
Ramona Engram; Martha, Bir­
die Shuttlesworth Warder, Dew­
ey Coldiron.

Danny Williams. Sudan Hornet 
Back. No. 22 will be playing 
football in the All-Star game, in 
the Astrodome inHouston, July 
29 following the Coaches clinic. 
Wiliams, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Sonny Williams, is a 1976 
graduate of Sudan High. He 
plans to attend the University of 
Texas in Arlington this fall 
where he has signed a letter of 
intent to play football. The 185 
pounder was named to All-Dis­
trict Football team on the offen­
sive, as one of the three 
Running Backs. Williams won 
honorable mention on the De­
fensive as Linebacker, during 
his senior year.

* * * * *
Visiting here last week in the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. G.C. 
Ritchie were her neice and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Jay Riley, 
Keith and Kevin of Clovis, N.M. 
(Also visiting was their grand­
daughter, April Rudd of Lub­
bock. Her mother, Jan Rudd, 
came for her Sunday afternoon. 

* * * * *
Mr. Joe Wilkinson spent a 

week in Denver, Colo, visiting 
her daughter and son-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Greef; a week 
in Casper, Wyoming with her 
daughter and son-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Attaway and 
family. They also stayed a week

An investment in Your Future -'‘ -IIZ*'- — -
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"For where your treasure is. there will your heart be also"

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 
Rev. Floyd Dunn 
507 West Second, Mineshoe

UNITED PENTECOSTOL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE 
CHURCH f  201 E. Av«. C 
George Green, Pastor

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH
621 S. First
Alton Richards, Elder

I FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
lJO W. Ave. G 

I Rev. Walter Bartholf 
1 Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
| Worship 11:00

vATOi AMERICAN 
METHODIST MISSWN 

| \ \ t .  D. s. 5th Sfr’def 
R.Q. Chavez, Pastor

FIRST PRESDYTERIAN 
Morton Highway 
Edwin L, Manning, Pastor 
Sunday Morning Servica

|CHURCH OF 
THE NAZARENE 
Ninth & Ave. C 
David Gray, Pastor 
CALV/RY BAPTIST CHURCH 
1733 W. Ave. C 
Junes Williams, paster

TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH 
314 E. Ave. B 
Rev. David Evetts

MULESHOE 
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
517 S. First 
H. D. Hunter, Pastor

JEHOVAH’S WITNESS 
Friuna Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Minister

RICHLAND HILLS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
17th & West Ave. D 
Gerald Pepper, Pastor
PROGRESS SECOND 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Clifford Slay, Past r 
1st and 3rd Sundays
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The (hutch is God s appointed agency in 
this world for spreading the knowledge of 
His love for man and of His demand for 
man to respond to that love by loving his 
neighbor. Without this grounding in the 
love of God, no government or society or 
way of life will long persevere and the 
freedoms which we hold so deor will in­
evitably perish. Therefore, even from a 
selfish point of view, one should support 
the Church for the soke of the welfare of 
himself and his family. Beyond that, how­
ever, every person should uphold and 
participate in the Church because it tells 
the truth about man’s life, death and 
destiny; the truth which alone will set him 
free to live as a child of God.

Man’s first reactions to another is based on out­
ward appearances, and only time will help him 
to know the heart of pnother. God knows, imme­
diately, every attitude of the heart, whether it is 
good or bad.
"Hleaaed are the pure in heart: for they shall nee 
God.”
There are many rewards for those that follow 
the Lord. “Let the heart of them rejoiee that Meek 
the Lord."

Colemon Adv. $mrt.

Complim ents o f

AVI INC.
Hwy 84 W. 2 72 -42 66

HAVERS FL0WERIAND
1 Flowers for a l l  occasions' 
2 7 2 -3 0 2 4  or 272-3116

BERRY ELECTRIC
R esidentia l-C om m erica I -  Industrial 
le rv ic e  104 E. A v e  B 2 7 2 -3 3 7 5  

Res *  2 72 -47 46

BRATCHER MOTOR 
SUPPLY

107 E A venue B 2 7 2 -4 2 8 8

Oairq  
Queen

M oigl* H ow kim
272-3412

Id o l l y  CUP DRIVE IN
H am burgers -ch icken -sh rim p
Twist Cone Ice Cream  
102 E .A ve B 2 7 2 -8 9 5 7

Compliments o f

m r» u
202 E.Ash St. 2 7 2 -4 2 2 2

G ibson ’s
D I S C O U N T  C I N T I R  :
1723 West Am erican B lvd.

^£2^4306,

MULESHOE CO-OP 
GINS

401S.FWST
MULESHOE

TEXAS 7*347

PH. 2724511

TORO GRAIN
D ivis ion  o f  O lto n  Feed Y ard s, Inc . 

O lto n ,  Texas 2 8 5 -2 6 3 4

HOWARD I. WATSON
A I fa I fa Hay

2 7 2 -3 5 5 2  2 7 2 -4 0 3 8

r

TEMPLO BAUTISTA 
Rev, Ynes’ Aleman 
Sunday School 9:45am 
Preching Service 10:45 am 
Training Hoar 6:00 pm 
Preaching Service 7:00 pm 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 8:00 pml

MULESHOE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
8th Street & Ave. G 
Boh *d, Pastor

ST. „ ..IN LUTHERAN 
Lariat, Texas 
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor 
Sunday School Classes 
10:00 a.m.
Worship Services 
T  *.) a.m.

FIRbT BAPTIST CHURCH 
220 W. Ave. E 
Rev. J. E. Meeks

SPANISH
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
East 6th and Ave. F 
Rev. Hipcllto Pecina

ST. MATTHEW 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
W. Third
E. McFrazier, Past 

NORTHSIDE 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
117 E. Birch Street

PROGRESS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Progress, Texas 
Danny Curry

SIXTEENTH & D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Sunday-10;30 a.m.
Evening-6 p.m. 
Wednesday-8 p.m.
Terry Bouchelle, Minister

IMMACULATE 
CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Father Timothy Schwertner 
Northeast ot City in 
Morrison Edition

MULESHOF 
CHURCH f
C .'vie ’’
Royce

BAILEY ^ O H T Y  
MEMORIAL PARK

"Every S erv ice  A Sacred Trust1 
2 7 2 -4 3 8 3

BLACK INSURANCE 
AGENCY

105 W . A venue D 272 -32 92

WESTERN DRUG
114 M a in

CM
218 M a in

ST. CLAIRS
110 M a in

Complim ents o f

STATE LINE IRRIGATION
L itt le fie ld -M u le s h o e -L e v e lla n d

BOB’S SAFETY CENTEI
W heel A lig n in g , Brakework 
A u tom otive  A ir  C o nd ition ing  
272 -3 0 4 3

WHITE’S CASHWAY |DARI-DELITE DRIVE IN
210 N .  First

Take O u t  O rders 2 7 2 -4 4 8 2

FIRST NATIONAL BANKl
" Home O w n e d ’

224  S.First

LAMBERT C l t ^ H S
Steam carpe t c lean in g  
D rapery c lean ing  
123 M a in  S t. 2 7 2 -4 7 2 6

GROCERY 402
"W here friends m eet and p rice  is ta lk ’

WHITT-WATTS-REMPE 
IMPLEMENT CO

John D eere D ea le r  
M uleshoe 2 7 2 -4 2 9 7

WRINKLE WELDING 
l  MACHINE

909  W .A m erican  B lvd . 2 7 2 -4 4 8 6

in Roosevelt, Utah, visiting her 
son and daughter-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Wilkinson and 
children.

*  *  •  *  ♦

Mrs. Linda King and boys of 
Spearman visited the weekend 
in the home of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnnie Bellar.

• * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Prokop 

and girls of Odessa visited over 
the weekend in the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Dorman 
Chester. Mrs. Prokop attended 
the bridal shower honoring 
Shelly Hargrove, bride-elect of 
Curtis Chester. He is Mrs. 
Prokop’s nephew.

* * * * *
Mrs. Jan Rudd of Lubbock 

visited Sunday afternoon in the 
home of her parents. Mr. and 
Mrs. G.C. Ritchie. April return­
ed home with her. She had 
visited here since Thursday. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Fisher and 

children of Ralls are visiting 
here this week with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Roy Fisher. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Jeff Lynskey and 

Bradley of Lubbock visited Fa­
ther's Day with her family, the 
Bud Provences.

Fawn and Shane Baker of 
Muleshoe are vistiing this week 
with their father, Mark, their 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dexter Baker and other rela­
tives.

Mr. and Mrs. Malcom Martin 
and boys returned home from 
vacationing last week near Az­
tec, N.M. and Durango, Colo. 

* * ***
Tom Henderson returned ome 

recently from visiting in Truth 
or Consequences, N.M. for the 
past two weeks. Also vacation­
ing there were Mr. and Mrs. 
Bonnie Narramore.

* * * * *
Visiting here with Mr. and 

Mrs. Noble Dudgeon and boys 
is her mother.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Doty and 

Donald were in Midland over 
the weekend, to be with their

daughter and son-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Wayne Gore and 
new granddaughter, Stephanie 
Ann. Mrs. Doty remained theire 
to be with her daughter for a few 
days.

* * * * *
Members of the Ruth Sunday 

school class of the First Baptist 
Church had their husbands as 
guests with a back yard picnic, 
June 15 in the home of Mrs. 
Fred Meeks. This was for their 
June-July social. Hostesses in­
cluded Mrs. Pete Lance, Mrs. 
Kenneth Notes, Mrs. Calvin 
Baker and Mrs. Buddy Pickett.
Following the picnic supper, 

musical entertainment was pro­
vided by Buddy Pickett, Alton 
Wimberly and Noble Dudgeon.
Others attending were Geneva 

Glascock. Kenneth Noles. and 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick West, Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Harper, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Doty. Mr. and 
Mrs. B.J. Markham, Mr. and
Mrs. G.C. Ritchie, Mr. and
Mrs. Billy Chester, Mr. and
Mrs. M.V. Summers and their
daughter, Robyn.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick West spent 
one night last week visiting her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Chester of Littlefield.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Hardy 

visited recently in Nowata, Ok­
lahoma, with their granddaugh­
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Estes and Jennifer.

* * • • •
Mrs. Ernest Pennington was in 

Lubbock last week to visit with 
her granddaughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Robin Taylor; and in San 
Antonio to visit with her daugh­
ter and son-in-law, Mr. and 
Mrs. S.R White. While there, 
they fished on the Canyon Lake. 

* * * * *
Visiting here with Mr. and 

Mrs. Arnold Beckett is her 
sister from Missouri.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Min- 

chew and boys and Mr. and 
Mrs. John Kropp, all of Here­
ford visited over Father’s Day 
weekend with their parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Claud Kropp.

Noted Speakers 
Scheduled For Farm 
Bureau Meet

An outstanding array of speak­
ers will address the Texas Farm 
Bureau Statewide Commodity 
Conference for Policy Develop­
ment July 6-7 in Waco. Sessions 
will be in the Waco Convention 
Center.

County Farm Bureau presi­
dents and chairmen of county 
peanut, rice, cotton and dairy 
commodity divisions are invited 
to the Waco meeting which will 
get under way at 3 p.m., July 6. 

The meeting is being held in 
preparation for the organiza­
tion’s policy development pro­
cess which gets under way soon 
in counties.

Local commodity meetings 
have been held recently in 
counties to “ surface” issues 
related to those commodities. 
These issues will be discussed 
at the statewide conference and 
recommendations made for con­
sideration at county annual con­
ventions later in the year. 

Congressman W. R. (Bob) 
Poage of Waco, vice chairman of 
the U.S. House Agriculture 
Committee, will talk on the 
"Farm Program Outlook for 
1977" at the opening session. 
Two Farm Bureau leaders will 

speak at a banquet that evening 
at the Holiday Inn on Interstate 
35. Bob Delano, vice president 
of the American Farm Bureau 
Federation and president of the 
Virginia Farm Bureau, will dis­
cuss "National Legislation in 
1977." TFB President Carrol 
Chaloupka will speak on “ Ac­
tion Today -- Results Tomor­
row."

Farm Bureau and agricultural 
research and education officials 
will address a general session 
Wednesday morning. John 
Datt, director of the AFBF's 
Washington office, will discuss 
"Government Regulations and 
You in 1977." Dr. Jarvis Miller, 
director of the Texas Agricultur-

Rockefeller v is its lta ly ’s 
quake area.

al Experiment Station, will 
speak on "Research for Low 
Cost Production.”

"Extension Education Needs 
for Texas Producers" will be 
handled jointly by Dr. H.O. 
Kunkel. Dean of Agriculture at 
Texas A&M University; and Dr. 
Daniel C. Pfannstiel, new Agri­
cultural Extension director.

Warren Newberry. TFB execu­
tive director, will talk on "State 
Issue in 1977.”
Luncheon speaker on July 7 

will be Rep. Bill Clayton, Speak­
er of the Texas House of 
Representatives. His topic will 
be "Texas Agriculture -- Num­
ber One.”

Individual commodity meet­
ings will be held prior to 5:30 
p.m. adjournment.

Boyd Rice, Rosemont, 111., 
southwest manager for United 
Dairy Industry Associations,will 
speak to the TFB Dairy Division 
on "Milk and Milk Products- 
Promotion.”
Troy Barton, Park Ridge. III., 

assistant director of commodity 
activities for the AFBF, will 
review recent legislation for the 
Peanut Division.
Dr. Ed Stivers, vice president 

of Rogers Delinted Cottonseed 
Co. of Waco, will discuss “Cot­
tonseed for Human Consump­
tion" at the Cotton Division 
meeting.
U.S. Department of Agricul­

ture officials, at yet unannounc­
ed. will speak at the Rice 
Division meeting.
State chairman of advisory 

committees for the four divi­
sions will meet that evening to 
make recommendations for con­
sideration at county Farm Bu­
reau annual meetings.

State chairmen are: Milk - Don 
Smith, Sulphur Springs in Hop­
kins County; Peanuts • Clifton 
Stacy, Pearsall in Frio County; 
Cotton - Vester Smith, Loop in 
Gaines County; and Rice - John 
Williams. Angleton in Brazoria 
County.

ToroCut
Your W ater 

Bill
lus ta ll An Automatic 

Law* Sprimkllmg System
Water While You Sleep”

Twin (G )
Yard Sprinkler Systems _  „

LESLIE GARY Olton Rout*
Phone 889-J8M INSTALLATION A ND REPAIRS PHinview

*



B ailey County Jo u rn a l, Sunday June 4 7 ,  1976, Page 9

U ffk llT * *
TO BUY? 

TO SELL? 
m . RESULTS?

OPEN RATES
1st insertion, per word -$.09 
2nd and add., per word $.06 

NATIONAL RATES 
1st insertion, per word $.11 
2nd and add., per word- $.07 
Minimum Charge - $.50 
CARD OF THANKS - $3.00 
Classified Display - $1.25 per 
column inch.

Double Rate for Blind Ads • 
DEADLINE FOR INSERTION 
Noon Tuesday for Thursday 
Noon Friday for Sunday 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO CLASSIFY. REVISE OR 
REJECT ANY AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR 

ANY ERROR AFTER AD HAS 
RUN ONCE.

s a r a i m *
1 PERSONALS

***************************** 
PTL (PRAISE THE LORD)
Channels 28 and 3. 8:30 - 10:30 
a.m. Monday through Friday. 
15-12s-tfc
*****************************

3 HELP WANTED 
*****************************

WANTED: LVN on 3 to 11 shift. 
Good salary and benefits. Apply 
in person at Amherst Manor. 
3-24s-tfc

NEEDED: Electric motor re- 
winders. assembly men and 
single phase repairmen. Mule- 
shoe Electric 272-3330.
3-25s-4tc

WANTED: Beautician at Main 
Street Beauty Shop. 272-3448. 
3-21s-tfc

WANTED: StilT taking appli­
cations for workers at Allsup's 
7-11.
3-46s-4tc

********************,*,*„,„
5 APTS. FOR RENT **♦**************************

MOVING NOW - Nice 1. 2 and 3 
bedroom apartments. Fully car­
peted, individual heat-air. 1 I 2 
baths, utilities paid. play­
ground, laundry facilities. 

Saratoga.Gardens 
1300 Walnut Street 

Friona, Texas 
247-3666 

Office hours 10-6
5-3t-tfc

8 REAL ESTATE*»•►*»»«*»«»*» *»*****»«»»,„«»,

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom house 
on 406 Austin. Exclusive.

E.E. HOLLAND 
REAL ESTATE 

113 WEST AVENUE D 
PHONE 272-3292 

B-24s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, three 
bath brick home. Contact Andy 
Douglass. 272-3001.
8-24t-tfc

FOR SALE: A large 3 bedroom 
stucco home with large living 
area, two baths. Close to 
school. Priced to sell.

Brick vaniere, 3 bedroom, 1 
3/4 bath, living room, den. 
Automatic underground lawn 
sprinkler. Good location.

180 acres for sale. Eight miles 
.vest of Muleshoe on south side 
jf highway 84. Three irrigation 
wells.

Smallwood Real Eatate 
116 E. Ave. C 

Muleshoe, Texaa

FOR SALE: 522 West American 
Blvd building and land. Call 
806-797-7742.
8-23s-9tc
FOR SALE: 181 Acres irrigat­
ed. 1 well . Lays real good on 
highway. West of Progress.

160 acres irrigated. 6" wells. 
North of Bovina on FM high­
way.
320 acres north of Bovina. 

Priced to sell.
15 acres with new 3 bedroom 

I 3/4 bath home. Has 4" well. 
Sheds and corrals. Near 
Progress.

J.B. SUDDERTH REALTY 
INC.

BOX 627
FARWELL, TEXAS 

481-3288
8-15t-tfc ____

SALES, LOANS 
AND

APPRAISALS
In Bailey County 30 Years

KREBBS
REAL ESTATE

210 S. 1st________

FOR SALE: No. 200 John Deer 
haystacker and stack mover. 
806-889-3409.
IO-24s-tfc

Your neighbors trade at STATE' 
LINE IRRIGATION for all their 
irrigation needs. Why not you? 
Muleshoe, Littlefield, & Level- 
land.
10-45s-tfc

FOR SALE: 68 MF 410 combine. 
Gas. cab. Good condition. 2 
grain trucks. 272-5564.
10-26t-2tp
_____ . . 4. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . * . . ______ . . . . . . . . .

FOR SALE: 40 HP Electric 
Irrigation motor with switch 
boxes. $950. Phone 272-4642. 
IO-2ls-tfc

FOR SALE: 1970 model Mack 
cab-over tractor. Excellent con­
dition. Depreciated out. Priced 
to sell. Call John Bingham. Day 
247-2724. Night 247-3274. 
10-25s-6tc

40 Horse Hollow shaft electric 
motor. Switch complete. 272- 
4112.
10- 25s-3tp

*****************************

11 FOR SALE OR TRADE 
*********************•*•****?
FOR SALE: 1974 three bed­
room, two bath mobile home. 
Small equity and take up pay­
ments. 272-3378. After 5 p.m.
11- 25t-4tc

FOR SALE: 15 ft. Mon-Ark bass 
boat. Johnson 33 HP motor with 
tilt dilly trailer. 1 Ez-Go golf 
cart. 1 Chusman golf cart. Call 
272-3994 or 119 West Third 
before 6 p.m.
1 l-26t-tfc

FOR SALE: 15 ft. self contained 
camper $950. 6 HP Mercury 
boat motor. Phone 272-4895 or 
see at 314 East Date.
I l-26t-3tc

Reduced by $1000 for quick 
sale). 1969 American Mobile 
Home. 12 x 65. Call 272-4044 or
272-3135.
ll-26s-2tp

FOR SALE BY M.D. GUN- 
STREAM: Good 4 pea green
baled hay. Call 272-4515 or
272-4709.
ll-lOi-tfC

FOR SALE: One year old white 
stove. Like new. Call 272-4451 
or 272-4113 after 5 p.m.
II -26t-2tc

FOR SALE: Travel trailer. 16 
foot has shower, commode, 
electric refrigerator and water 
heater, 3 burner stove with 
oven, 2 butane bottles. Jacks, 
awnings, and many features. 
303 East Cedar after 6:30.
11 -26t-4tp

*********•*•****•****•****•••4
15 MISCELLANEOUS 

******************************
Watkins Products sold at 1610 
West Avenue B, Muleshoe. 
15-22s-13stp

WANTED: House keeper one 
day a week. Come by the 
Journal office for more informa­
tion.
15-25t-tfc

NEW DOG
BREEDERS NEEDED 

Start now raising purebred 
dogs for PROFIT. Get highest 
prices Coast to Coast. IF YOU 
QUALIFY, we assist all new 
breeders in every phase of the 
business. Possible to turn ‘A 
acre of your idle ground into 
$10,000 yearly income or 
more. CALL today 318-865 
0567 or write (include your 
phone number) - KENNELS, 
376 Leo Avenue, Shreveport, 
La. 71105.
!5-25t-5tp

FOR SALE: 2 - 1974 Yamaha 
motorcycles. Contact Mike Jes­
ter at 272-3822 or at work 
272-5527.
15-22t-tfc

PHILLIPS HOUSE OF MUSIC 
118 Main

Clovia, New Mexico
Pianos, organs, band instru­
ments. new and used. Profes­
sional repairs, sheet music, 
rentals, terms.

Phone:505-763-5041.
J5-30s-tfc

Lose weight and excess. Water 
with Fluidex Plus plan, conveni­
ent 2 in 1 tablet. Western Drug
15-26s-3tp

Lose weight with Grapefruit diet 
plan with Dladax - Reduce 
excess fluids with Fluidex. Wes­
tern Drug
15-26s-5tp

Ditching Service. Reasonable 
rates. 272-3982.
15-26t-8tc

C l
,  6  

v

T h e
C o n s u m e r
A le r t

by John L. Hill 
Attorney General

AUSTIN— Protecting the 
consumer was a major con­
cern of the attorneys general 
from more than 40 states 
and U.S territories attend­
ing the 70th annual meeting 
of the National Association 
of Attorneys General re­
cently

Our office, which hosted 
the meeting in San Antonio, 
was an active participant in 
meetings of the 14 
N.A.A.G. committees, 
where much substantive dis­
cussion of consumer-related 
matters took place, and 
where resolutions were

hammered out which 
were adopted by 
N.A.A.G. general 
bly.

One such measure, pro­
posed by our office's chicl 
of consumer protection, 
Philip Maxwell, resolved to 
ask that Congress amend 
federal bankruptcy laws to 
close a loophole which in ef­
fect permitted violation o( 
state consumer laws by un­
scrupulous merchants in cer­
tain limited instances.

Consumer protection at­
torneys said that some states 
have reported cases where 
corporations that are defen­
dants in deceptive trade 
practices suits brought by 
state attorneys general have

used federal bankruptcy 
laws to circumvent justice.

This comes about when 
the corporation being sued 
files a petition for bank­
ruptcy Under current fed­
eral law, all state legal ac­
tions are then held up until 
the bankruptcy proceedings 
are settled. Some corpora­
tions allegedly have misused 
this provision of the law as 
an obstructionist tactic to 
evade state legal actions, 
while continuing to operate 
under a special “ Chapter 
11" bankruptcy provision

Another resolution passed 
by N.A.A.G. supports 
enactment of federal legisla­
tion to require that packaged 
foods and other products be

Water Quality Board Slates Public Hearing

Card Of 
Thanks
Pat and I will be going back to 

Temple soon, where I will enter 
the Hospital for another series 
of treatments. Before we go let 
us tell each and everyone of you 
wonderful people how we appre­
ciate your prayers, cards, let­
ters, your visits and all of the 
delicious food.
God Bless all of you and we 

love you.
Mary and Pat Childers 

P.S. Be back about July 17. 
26s-ltp

The Texas Water Quality 
Board will hold a public hearing 
in Austin June 30 for the 
purpose of receiving evidence 
relevant to a proposed state 
water quality management pro­
gram for fiscal year 1977, and to 
consider the proposed municipal

LCC Offers 
Basic Real 
Estate Course

Two courses to help individuals 
increase their earning potential 
in the real estate field will get 
underway in July as a part of the 
Continuing Education Division 
at Lubbock Christian College.

Starting July 6 will be Basic 
Real Estate, which provides 
initial instruction necessary for 
the state examination. The 
Class continues through August 
12 and meets each Tuesday and 
Thursday from 6:30 to 9:30 p.m.
The second course is Broker­

age and Marketing. It will be 
held on Tuesdays and Thurs­
days from July 20 through 26.

New to LCC's list of course 
offerings is Speedwriting, a 
nationally known system of al­
phabetic shorthand. It is sche­
duled for July 20 through Au­
gust 26.
Two hobby-oriented courses 

also start in July. They are 
Liquid Silver and Macrame.
For further informtion or pre­

registration contact Frankie Fa- 
ver at 792-3221, extension 222.

j L i H u i i i m m

On Wall
Slreel

By Bob Hitt 
Lentz , Newton & Co.

w« Covar Pickup 

Truck S«a»i

M c C tra lc k  
Upholstry l  

Drapery
1 0 0 9  S. 1ST

272-4660

It should come as a shocker 
that the median price for a new 
single-family house is $43,700. 
Now how many younger couples 
do you know who can afford 
shelter at that figure? In order 
to get the cost of housing down 
to an "affordable" level, the 
no-frills house is being pushed. 
That means a stripped-down 
version, lower ceilings, and no 
moldings around the walls, in 
order to get around the ever-in­
creasing cost of housing.

Now comes the mobile home 
industry which is quick to point

, !55*************************
9 AUTOMOBILES 

•*••*•***********************
FOR SALE: 1970 Buick Elcctra 
225. Loaded. Good condition. 
Low milage. New steel belted 
tires. Call 285-2016.
9-25s-8tc
,*****»**♦•**•******♦******** 
10 FARM EQUIP. FOR SALE 
****••****•*••**•**•**•*••*'
FOR SALE: MF tractor with 
backhoc and loader. 272-3378. 
After 5 p.m.
10 25l 4tc

POULTRY DRESSING: All poul­
try dressed, bagged and readied 
for your freezers. Rabbits also 
dressed by us. Call 385-5506 
Lamb Co. Locker, Littlefield, 
Texas.
15-22t-4tsc

I
FO^SALE^Pa^^ndPcwlTMT 
radios. Base and mobiles.! 
$120 and up. Call 272-3163.

FOR SALE: Bright long stem­
med wheat straw. 50 cents a 
bale in field. 75 cents from barn 
and $20 per ton. 965-2348. 
15-26s-3tc

FOR SALE: 16” well casing, 
new steel 18” 2c a lb.; 6” and 
8" column pipe. '/> prices for 
junk iron.

FARWELL PIPE A IRON 
601 Ave. A 

Farwell, Teaaa
15-46t tfcFOR SALE: 32 acres well 
located. Two bedroom house 
and a trailer court.
Some one acre tracts for sale.

POOL REAL ESTATE 
214 E. AMERICAN BLVD. 

272-4716
8-2Qs-tfc

Puppies to give away. 6 weeks 
old. Mixed breed. Call 272-3267 
before 9 a.m. or after 8 p.m. 
l5-26s-ltc

CHALLENGE
YOURSELF

TODAY'S ARMY IS LOOK­
ING FOR YOUNG MEN AND 
WOMEN, 17 - 34, WHO 
WANT A CHALLENGING 
JOB WITH A FUTURE. 
WE’LL PAY $361 A MONTH 
TO THOSE WHO QUALIFY 
FOR ONE OF THESE:

JOBS OPENINGS
Radio Operators..... ............. 47
Infantryman.........................’83
Armor Recon Specialists*.. 99
Field Artillery.................... 217
Field Wiremen ...........  6
Powermen............ . . .............20
Ammo Storagemen............. 18
PBX Operators..... ................4
Artillery Surveyors............. 42
Medical Corpsmen— ........ 313
Cooks.................................. 10

ASK YOUR LOCAL ARMY 
RECRUITER ABOUT EN 
LISTING NOW OR RESERV­
ING A JOB FOR UP TO 270 
DAYS.

ACCEPT THE 
CHALLENGE

CALL COLLECT
SSG JIM DcLaGAR/A 

(806) 296 9228

facilities construction grant pri­
ority funding list for the same 
period of time.
The state's water quality man­

agement program for the up­
coming fiscal year beginning 
September 1 outlines the 
Board’s commitment to the 
enhancement of the state water­
ways and describes the pro­
grams designed to enable the 
state to meet the goals estab­
lished for 1977, 1983, and 1985 
by amendments to the Federal 
Water Pollution Control Act.
Major program elements for 

1977 remain virtually enchang- 
ed from the current year, and 
include management of munici­
pal facilities, permit compli­
ance, comprehensive water qua­
lity management planning, and 
stream and effluent monitoring. 
The Board’s remaining on-going 
functions will be continued and.

where practical, expanded to 
provide support for the water 
quality management effort.

During the year, paticular em­
phasis will be placed on dealing 
with matters relating to the 
disposal of industrial solid waste 
and in formulating the 208 
program which is areawide wa­
ter quality management plan­
ning. This program locates and 
plans areawide wastewater 
treatment systems for 20 years 
in the future.
Another important aspect of 

the program for the new year 
will be an assessment and 
evaluation of the non-point 
sources of pollution such as 
urban runoff, rainfall runoff 
from agricultural type opera­
tions, and pollution resulting 
from subsidence.
The proposed municipal facili­

ties construction grant priority 
funding list for fiscal year 1977

ranks projects according to the 
municipal funding construction 
grant priority rating process and 
includes projects received prior 
to December 31. 1975.
The hearing is to be held in 

Room 118 of the Stephen F. 
Austin State Office Building 
starting at 9:00 a.m.

labelled uniformly. We em­
phasized, however, that 
states should not be limited 
in their efforts to see that 
consumers purchasing such 
goods get the full weight or 
measure stated on the pac­
kage.

We felt that consumers, 
retailers, intrastate pack­
agers, farmers, and man­
ufacturers all need to be as­
sured that the weights and 
measures indicated on pac­
kaged goods are accurate.

In line with that feeling, 
we additionally opposed any 
efforts to prohibit or impede 
the used of statistically valid 
methods of determining if 
there are short weights or 
measures in lots of packaged 
goods.

Antitrust efforts to protect 
the public received the atten- 
tiy” of the assembled attor­
neys general also, in the 
form of a resolution favor­
ing parens patriae legislation 
recently passed by both the 
U.S House and Senate, and 
now in the conference 
committee state.

6 LIN WATKINS
9 6 5 - 2 1 9 6

965-2365
C e c i l  H o l t  
2 7 2 - 4 8 0 2

P i p e l i n e  R e p a i r  
We l l  T i e - In s  

P o r t a b l e  W e l d i n g

Prowl «■
Cotton Tour

July 2,1976
10:00  a.m . to  11:00 a.m . 

M oot A t :
Riverside Chemical Co.

2 % m** Muleshoe 
on

Clovis Hwy

k b *:

Vm lu y mi>'.

•v.;

out that the mobile home has 
always been affordable and 
offers variety that just can't be 
matched by the conventional 
house. Would you believe a two 
story, five bedroom mobile 
home? A Michigan mobile home 
builder will offer a two story 
model for $22,500, beginning 
next month. A Dallas mobile 
home manufacturer is offering a 
1300 square foot model for 
$16,000 to $18,000 designed to 
compete head-on with the no­
frills house which sells for 
$21,000 to $24,000.

Another new approach by the 
mobile home industry is the 
package deal where the house 
and lot in an attractive sub-divi­
sion can be financed together. 
This encourages attractive parks 
and mobile home developments 
which indicates that the mobile 
home industry is building up 
while the housing industry is 
building down.
The average mobile home has 

sold for around $11,000, priced 
to reach the family with an 
income of $6,000 to $9,000. The 
new push is toward the larger 
units selling for $13,000 to 
$23,000 which taps the market 
of families with incomes of 
$9,000 to $15,000 annually.
The two toughest obstacles to 

overcome are the limits on 
financing of mobile homes and 
the strong community resist­
ance to them. But. have you 
seen sonic of the Florida retire­
ment mobile home parks lately? 
They are stunning in design and 
appearance. A new federal con­
struction code has just gone into 
effect for mobile homes. It has 
imposed tough safety and quali­
ty standards but it replaced a 
hodge-podge of state and local 
codes. The Federal safely and 
quality standard will also make 
acceptance of mobile home 
housing much more popular 
than in the past.

USDA proposes rules for
grain inspection.
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"We're building a new standard for 
Center Pivot right here. It's called 
SERVICE." Give us a call today.

Special limited offer:

10V> year lease plan with first 6 months interest free. 
18 months between first and second payment, giving 
you two crop incomes before second payment.

H EREFO RD-806-364-6900

MULESHOE-806-272-4266

CLOVIS -505-763-4417

Red dye No. 
by FDA.

2 is banned

%

COST.

*
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Mrs. Williams led the study 
Tuesday afternoon when the 
WMU met at the church. Their 
study was taken front Ephesians 
Second chapter. Mrs. Richard­
son read the call to prayer 
calendar with Mrs. Pierce offer­
ing the prayer for the mission­
aries. Mrs. Battles gave tht 
benediction. Attending were 
Mrs. C.A. Williams, Mrs. E.O. 
Battles. Mrs. Rowena Richard 
son. Miss Vina Tugman and 
Mrs. P.K. Pierce.*****
Jerry Sowder has a friend. 

Matthiois Jonas, from Rinteln. 
Germany visiting with him. 
Jerry and Matt became ac­
quainted when Matt was an 
exchange student at Bula School 
in 1973-74. The boys have made 
a trip to see the Carlsbad

Caverns; went to Lubbock to see 
the All American game, and 
several other places. Plans are 
in the making for a fishing trip.

Matt was accompanied by a 
friend from Germany. They plan 
to return next Wednesday. Matt 
will be entering the army soon 
after his return home.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Cannon 

recently made a trip to Claren­
don, to visit with her brother 
and sister. They visited in the 
home of her sister, Mrs. Ella 
Simmons and with her brother 
and wife. Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Hardin, at the Clarendon Nurs­
ing Home.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Crume and 

daughter. Diane drove to Altus, 
Okla. Monday. They went to 
visit with his sister. Mrs. Leo 
Newberry, a patient in the Altus 
hospital.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Swanner 

of DeLon. spent the weekend 
visiting with their son and 
family. Mr. and Mrs. Kennith 
Swanner and another son and

family, Mr. and Mrs. Eugene 
Swanner, of Jackson, Calif. 
They were all guests in their 
home. Monday they drove to the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. C.A. 
Williams, then later drove to 
Earth and spent the day with 
another sister. Mr. and Mrs. 
Lowell Walden.*****
Mr. and Mrs. W.D. Clawson of 

Lovington, N.M. spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Row­
land. Their daughter Debbie 
returned home with them after a 
stay of two weeks here with the 
Rowlands. *****
Mr. and Mrs. H.M. Black 

spent the weekend with her 
sister and husband. Mr. and 
Mrs. E.G. Mahagan. from Pe­
tersburg. Sunday , they all visit­
ed at Pep, N.M. with her 
sister-in-law and famiy, Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Dupler. Mr. and Mrs. 
Cecil Golden, from Phoenix, 
Ariz. was with them.*****
Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Clawson 

and sons. Edward. Michael and 
her mother, Mrs. Rice, of

Littlefield, spent Sunday with 
the Clawson’s daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Montgomery, and children, of 
Amarillo. *****
Mrs. Lee Carrol Simmons and 

boys. Gary Lee and Todd of 
Edmonson, spent Sunday after­
noon and night with their grand­
parents. Mr. and Mrs. F.L. 
Simmons. *****

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Bogard 
drove to Clovis Monday and had 
a visit with some old friends, 
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Ware.

*****
Mrs. Nolan Harlan, Mrs. John 

Blackman and Mrs. Dudley 
Cash of Portales, N.M. attended 
the salad supper given Monday 
evening at the Lubbock Chris­
tian College dining hall, for 
wives of the senior students of 
Sunset School of Preaching.

Mrs. Harlan went as guest of 
her daughter. Mrs. Rodney 
Marshall, of Whitharral. Mrs. 
Blackman and Mrs. Cash were 
guests of Mrs. Edd Scott.
This is an annual affair given

by wives of the junior class 
honoring wives of senior class. 
The theme for the program was 
"Ye Shall Know The Truth and 
Truth Shall Make You Free". 
There were 41 honored senior 
wives. *****

Mr. and Mrs. Alvis Rowland of 
Fort Worth are here visiting in 
the home of his brother. Mr.a 
in the home of his brother, Mr. 
and Mrs. J.D. Rowland.*****

Mr. and Mrs. John McCor­
mack and children. Cornell and 
Heather returned Saturday, 
from a weeks visit with relatives 
at Grants, N.M. Her mother and 
husband. Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Judentan, from Edna. Okla. 
were also with them.

*****
Mrs. Rockey Dewbrc and son, 

Michael, of Morton and Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Salyer and children, 
Shelly and Greg, of Friona were 
Father’s Day guests of their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Buck 
Medlin. *****
Mrs. John Withrow, now a

resident of the Amherst Manor, 
w as able to come out Sunday to 
visit with her son. Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Withrow'. She and Withrow 
were dinner guests of their son. 
Mr. and Mrs. James Withrow of 
Sudan.

I he community was sorry to 
here of the motorcycle accident, 
that a Sudan boy, Larry Don 
Bcllar was involved in Saturday 
night. Hope he is showing much 
improvement bv now. His 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Mac Bcllar live in the Bula 
community. He also has an 
uncle, Jeryl Bcllar.

*****
Mrs. A M. McBec is taking 

pleasure in a visit of her 
daughter. Mrs. Perry Spell, of 
Chattanooga, Tenn. Another 
daughter. Mrs. L.C. Childers of 
Wolforth also spent several days 
this week with them.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Clawson 

spent the weekend in Spear­
man. visiting in the home of her 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Kunselman.

Steve Sinclair is to finish his 
basic training this week at Fort 
Knox, Kentucky. He will be sent 
to Fort Sam Houston, and will 
receive his two weeks leave 
from there.

*****
Mrs. Marie Suggs of Lubbock 

is spending a few days this week 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
V.C. Weaver.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Cox and 

children, Jamie and Dcnnene; 
Mr. and Mrs. Darwin McBec 
and girls, Robin, Belinda and 
Mit/i, of Enochs; their parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Morris Phillips 
and son. Leon of Needmore; and 
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Whitten- 
burg, of Oklahoma Lane; all 
attended a Father's Day picnic, 
at the Clovis Park. Sundav.

Getty kidnap trial held 
in southern Italy.

Man,at 133,awarded hon­
orary High School diploma.

IRS says 1 in 4 giving to 
presidential fund.

Weather hurts crops in 
Europe.

Ethics Committee votes 
to investigate Sen. Sikes.

ATTENTION 
MULESHOE AIEA  

CATTLEMEN
...In regard to dead stock 
removal . . .  If you have a 
problem with service . . . 
whether In the feed yard or 
on the farm , . . Please 
give US a chancel Thank You.

YOUR LOCAL U S l0
COW DEALER IN

MULESHOE
Ph. 965-2903 
Mobil 965-2429

Mulusbou
l l-P r*d u (t»

6

Plus Deposit

32-oz. Btls. 
6-Pack

Grape 
Jelly
Spaghetti, All Varieties

Ragu
Sauce 5 ;,z
Pitter Patter, Vanilla Creme, 
Chocolate Fudge Sandwich

Keebler 
Cookies-;

Piggly
W iggly LOW PRICES

Prices good thru June 30 , 197 6 . 
We reserve the right to lim it 
quantities. None sold to dealers.

COCA COLA
OR

DR. PEPPERl

We W il l  Be C losed 
M onday Ju ly  5

We Redeem  ̂ Piggly Wiggly
{ M y  Welcomes Food 
■ S I  Stamp Customers

FfDtHil 
F000 COUPONS

Packer Trim 
Cook-Out Special Whole

BEEF
Swift 16-Lbs. And Up

BUTTERBAIl
BRISKETS TURKEYS

Lb.
Fresh, 3-Lbs. or More

Ground 
Beef
Farmer Jones, Whole, Cry-O-Vac,
Water Added

Smoked 
Picnics

Farmer Jones Famous Rope

Smoked
Sausage

Lb.
Sw ift’s Cornish

Game
Hens
Heavy Aged Beef

Round
Steak

20-oz.
Size

Lb.

V
/

Tide’s In...Dirt’s Out

TIDE
DETERGENT

Lb.

One (1)
84-oz.

Box

Bunte

Marshmallow
Peanuts
Libby’s

Vienna 
Sausage
Vaseline Lotion

Intensive 
Care

with $ 1 0  00 
purchase  or more

6-oz.
Pkgs.

5-oz.
Cans

6-oz.
Btl.

It’s Made From Real Fruit Juice Grated, Light

DRINKS
'Sweet

Juicy
Cantaloupes

l orOnions 2 Cello l U C  
Pkg

V \

Golden

Ripe
Bananas
Romatne, Red fc Green

Leaf Lettuce

VAN CAMP
TUNA

Head


