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Groom Remains 

Wet After 

2 ” Soaking
Groom remains soaked 

this week with
another 2.17 inches of rain­
fall accumulating during the 
past week. The largest 
amount fell on Monday, June 
2 with gauges in the City' 
showing over an inch of 
moisture.

The wheat crop in the area 
is ready to cut when the 
weather conditions allow the 
fields to dry. So far area 
farmers are taking the 
weather in stride though 
harvest and milo planting are 
both being delayed. No 
damage to crops is evident at 
this time.

Homemaking

Farewell Dinner Set 
Sunday For M sgr. Hand

Msgr. Kevin Hand will be 
honored Sunday. June 8 at 
St. Mary’s Hall with a fare­
well appreciation picnic and 
reception Msgr. Hand will 
be leaving Groom on the 
following week for his annual 
visit to his home in Ireland. 
When he returns to the 
States, he will be pastor of 
the Catholic church in 
Nazareth

Msgr. Hand has served in 
the Amarillo diocese since 
June of 1952. He came to St. 
Mary's Parish in September. 
19*5. He has served 
churches in the diocese in 
Amarillo. Wellington, Child­
ress. Dal hart. Vega and 
Dumas. He also served as

co-pastor for Christ the King 
in Lubbock before being 
transferred to Groom.

Father Hand will be saying 
his last Mass in Groom on 
Sunday. June 8. Father 
Zinzer will fill in until July 
when father Richard Neyer 
will be transferred to Groom 
from Barger

Everyone u  vited to the 
picnic and reception 
honoring Msgr. Hand. 
Persons are asked to bring a 
dish to pass to the noon 
luncheon. All drinks, 
utensils, etc. will be 
furnished.

For those uanable to 
attend the picnic, a reception 
will be held from 2:00 to 4:00 
p.m.

Area Baseball Games Called
Baseball season is suffer­

ing from the wet conditions 
as games last week and early 
this week have been canceled 
due to rain. Make-up games 
will be scheduled as soon as 
possible.

The Little League last by 
only one run on their last 
outing last Thursday in Clar-

endon against the Yankees. 
The Yankees scored 6 runs to 
Groom's 5. Corley Hickey 
scored two runs for Groom 
and teammates Rhett Pat­
terson, Bronte Britten and 
Kristy Case scored one a 
piece. Pitchers for the even­
ing were Bronte and Bruce 
Britten.

■ s

Underway
Summer Homemaking

projects are underway 
some 25 girls involved 
summer homemaki'g classes 
at Groom Schools. Mrs. Judy 
Babcock, sponsor, reports 
that 9 incoming freshmen 
will also soon begin projects.

Summer homemaking
projects will include sewing, 
refinishing furniture snd 
planning sessions for FHA. 
Some special cooking classes 
will also be held. Mrs. Bab­
cock stated that the classes 
are open to any interested 
individuals whether adults or 
students from the 
community. She will be at 
the school from 9 a.m. to 4 
p.m. weekdays through July 
3 and wilt be happy to assist 
anyone from the community 
with projects they would like 
to undertake.

She has scheduled a 
number of programs during 
the sessions and the public is 
more than welcome to 
attend. The first will be 
Monday. June 9 when Alice 
Wells gives a demonstration 
on lace weaving.

The second will be June 19 
conducted by Adela Kotara 
on quilt squares. The final 
program will be conducted 
by Joyce Hutsell on calli­
graphy, July 1.

All the programs will 
begin at 10 a.m.

This little ducky family got drenched 
Monday when a downpour left more than an 
inch of rain in Groom. The family of wooden

ducks handpainted by Darlene Jones adds 
just the right touch to the landscape.

Voters To Decide Run-off 
State Election Saturday

Voting in Primary run-off 
elections will be Saturday, 
June 8. Democrats will again 
vote at St. Mary’s and the 
Republicans will vote in the 
Math room at Groom 
Schools. The same entrance 
will be used.

Persons who voted in the 
ihimary election May 3 must 
cast ballots with the same 
jtarty in the run-off election. 
If you missed voting on May 
3, you can cast a ballot in 
cither the Democratic or 
Republican run-off.

Four places will be decid­
ed on the Republican ballot: 
For Lt. Governor, David 
Davidson faces Aaron L. 
Bullock; For Attorney 
General. Roy R. Barrera Jr. 
vs. Ed Walsh; For Commis­
sioner of the General Land 
Office. M.D. Anderson, Jr.' 
vs. Grady T. Yarbrough; and 
for Railroad Commissioner 
John Thomas Henderson vi. 
Milton E. Fox.

Races undecided in the 
Democratic primary and to

be voted on in the runoff will 
be as follows: Railroad Com­
missioner, John Sharp vs. 
P.S. Ervin; Justice of the 
Supreme Court Place 1, 
Oscar Mauzy vs. Shirley 
Butts; Justice of the 
Supreme Court. Place 2, 
Robert M. Campbell vs. Jim 
Brady; Justice of the

Supreme Court, Place 4, an 
unexpired term, Raul Gon­
zalez vs. Jay Gibson; Judge 
for the Court of Criminal 
Appeals. Place I, George 
“ Jorge" Martine;: vs. Rusty 
Duncan.

Polls open at 7:00 a.m. and 
will close at 7:00 p.m.

(^Community Calendar
Day Ckunp begins Tuesday 

for ages 5 and up. Call Donna 
Burton for more information 
or join us at the Park. June
10.

The Caiaan Coamty Roping
is set for July 27. There «rill 
be a meeting at Lonny 
Brown’s at 8:00 p.m. Friday, 
June 6, 310 Choctaw in 
Groom. Anyone interested 
please come. For more infor­
mation call 248-6241.

Free
lace weaving will be held 
Monday, June 9 at the school 
at 10:00 a.m. The public is 
invited to attend the demon­
stration by Alice Wells.

PaalsriB
be open Sunday.

Lazy Daxys meet Tuesday, 
June 10 in the home of 
Debbie Britten, 7:30 p.m.

( S r o o m  H e tu i

The Only N ew spaper 
in the  W orld 

In te re s ted  In Groom

248-3311

National Little League 

Week, June 9-15

Tuesday Grain Prices 
At Local Elevators

Cash prices on grain post­
ed al gfain elevators serving 
(he Groom area Tuesday
afternoon:

WHEAT S2.12 bushel 
MILO *».30 cwt.
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Mrs. Ellen Stapp attended 
the 64th anniversary of the 
Hartly Divises in Alanreed 
Sunday.
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CANON
Typewriters
Calculators

Steel Reed 
Electronic 

Typewriters

Authorized Sales *  Service
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BOX 985 • 1016 W 7TH • AMARILLO. TEXAS 79105

David Brown
248-5491
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Edna Terbush attended 
the Kunkel family reunion in 
Amarillo Sunday. Later in 
the day she visited in the 
home of her brother and 
wife, Mr. and Mrs. B.J. 
Kunkel. Others visiting there 
were Mr. and Mrs. Carter 
Veazy of Clovis, N.M., Mr. 
and Mrs. B.L. Kunkel, Clara 
Faye Rogers of Dun a s , Carl 
Kunkel Jr., Druciila Maxwell 
and Vernon Rogers of 
Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bralley 
visited in Las Vegas last 
week with their new grand­
son Jeffery Jordon and his 
three year old sister Taylor. 
Jeffery Jordan Bouchard 
arrived May 14 and weighed 
9 pounds and 11 ouiKes. He 
is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jeff Bouchard of 6S48 
Wheelbarrow Peak Drive in 
Las Vegas, Nev.

The Jake Lacys were in 
Turkey Sunday to take part in 
a Memorial Day service at 
the Dreamland Cemetery. 
Jake Lacy and Dr. Ronald 
Lacy of Amarillo were both 
part of the choir perform­
ing during the service.

Working With Your 
Interest In Mind

Congratulations
Groom 8th Grade Class

Valedictorian

Ben Weinheimer

Solutotorkin

Heather Patterson

Schools Out

h Everyone Have

A Safe 

And Fun Summer

Don't Forget 

V  about Baseball

Get out and 
see a game.

Good Luck and Have Fun

Brownie and Juniors At Sports Camp

June 10-14

State National Bank
243-5511 FDIC Groom, Texas

Irene Kotara attended the 
wedding of Jennifer Franklin 
to Mike Rapstine in Panhan­
dle Saturday night.

Marcia Davis and Gary 
Britten were recent 
graduates for West Texas 
State University in 
commencement exercises 
held for the spring of 1986.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Lacy 
spent Memorial Day in 
Turkey, Tex. with his 
brother, Jake Lacy.

Essie Cooper Knowles is 
enjoying a visit in Houston 
with her daughter Yvonne. 
Over the Memorial weekend 
she spent a wonderful four 
days with 27 children, grand­
children and great-grand­
children at a condominum at 
Cape Royale on Lake Living­
ston. She enjoyed boating 
and watching the children 
fish and play games.

On Thursday the 29, back 
in Houston, she celebrated 
her birthday with her family. 
The remainder of her visit 
will be spent with the 
different families in the area. 
She will be returning to 
Groom in early June.

Wynell Fincfc of Panhandle 
attended the graduation of 
her sister, Rose Leven Fri­
day.

Visiting in the home on 
Sunday afternoon were Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Babcock and 
Bill Babcock of Amarillo.

Mrs. Barbara Leven, Edna 
Terbush and Daniel Peters 
were shopping in Amarillo 
Friday.

Weight Watchers 
New Session starts 

Tvesday June 10, 
1986 at 6 p.m. 

Methodist Church 

in Panhandle. 

For more 

information Cali 
537-3393 or 

537-3710.

New Arrivals

Congratulations to Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike PWbemqjf of 
Perryton on the arrival of a 
son born Sunday, June 1, 
1986 in Amarillo. Adam 
Michael was the name 
chosen for the 6 pound, 9 
ounce new arrival. He is 
welcomed by his six-year-old 
sister, Audni.

Proud grandparents are 
Bobby Cornett of Groom and 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Podxemny 
of Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Buster Han- 
ing and daughter Jennifer 
announce the arrival of 
Jarrod Gilbert at 3:40 p.m., 
June 2. Jarrod weighed 5 
pounds and 13 .ounces and is 
welcomed also by his grand­
parents Mr. and Mrs. Peeler 
Haning of Fritch and Zoah 
Britten of Groom.

Nlghtln' Gals *

Mrs. Carl Homer and Mrs. 
B.F. Patterson hosted 
Nightin’ Gals Tuesday, April 
27 at 7 p.m. in the Hos­
pitality room of the State 
National Bank.

Mrs. Glynn D Harrell had 
high score and Mrs. W.M. 
Garmon had low score in 
games of Pinochle.

Others present were Mrs. 
L.T. Banks. Mrs. J.L. Case, 
Mrs. Joe Davis, Mrs. C.L. 
Fields, Mrs. Ted Friemel, 
Mrs. Kenneth Black, Mrs. 
John Hickox, Mrs. E.W. 
lamberson, Mrs. O.A. Pool, 
Mrs. Jim Wall. Mrs. R.W. 
Wills and Mrs. H.F. Brit­
ten.

Honor Roll
Eight hundred ten West 

Texas State University stu­
dents were included on the 
Dean’s List for the Spring 
semester.

Students must achieve a 
semester grade-point
average of at least 3.2S (of a 
possible 4.0) with a class load 
of at least 12 semes ter hours. 
Students whose GPAs are 
3.8S or better are listed on 
the President’s List.

Rets Jenkins was named to 
the President’s list with a 
GPA of 4.0.

Qualifying for the Dean’s 
List were Marcia Davis and 
Beth Kuehler.

Cards Of Thunks
We would like to express 

our sincere thanks to all our 
friends and relatives for the 
cards, phone calls, food and 
concern given us when Ir­
ma’s brother died in Wash­
ington. Your kindness will 
always be remembered.

Page and Irma Blackwell

To all who came to our 
reception and/or dance and 
to those who called, sent 
cards, flowers and gifts, we 
want to say a most sincere 
“ Thank you” for making our 
fortieth anniversary so 
special.

And to our family for the 
planning and work you did, 
we can never say “Thant: 
you” enough. This occasion 
leaves us with many, many 
fond memories. For us, it has 
been priceless.
Our sincerest appreciation to 
one and all and God bless I 
Bud and Margaret Babcock

DAilro n
will be [moral in celebration of Her 

f t t k  X t n k f ú iu

RC* reception given bg Her children 

jane T<k, l is t

F irs t Bnytist CkurcU Tctíow skíp jh ü
( jto o M i, 7e x js s  'P ít e s e  C o m u

d r
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Vacation Bible School 
June 9 ,10,12, & IS

6:30— 8:00P.M. 
Groom

United Methodist Church 

Ages 2 — 12yrs.

Babcocks Celebrate 
40 Years O f Marriage

NOTICE
The City of Groom needs your co-operation. 

The parking of semi-trucks, recreational vehicles 

and farm equipment on city streets is causing

Summer Reading 
Begins In June

' 'Celebrate America" i* 
the theme of the summer 
reading program at the 
Groom Branch Library.

The first story hour will be 
Wednesday, June 17 at 1 
p.m. at the Community Gub 
House.

The second story hour will 
be June 18 at 1 p.m. at the 
Gub House. The programs 
mil be presented by the 
Groom FHA girls under the 
direction of Loretta Kuehler.

All children age four and 
up are invited.

To commemorate the 
Fortieth Anniversary of their 
parents, the children of Bud 
and Margaret Babcock host­
ed a reception at 7:30 p.m. 
on May 31, 1986 in Groom 
Legion Hall.

A white an blue four-tiered 
cake was served from a white 
lace-covered table by grand­
daughter Karen Babcock 
while her sister, Susan, 
served punch.

A picture of the couple 
with their attendants, Zoah 
Britten and Tom Britten, was 
on display along with the top 
that adorned their wedding 
cake on May 27, 1946.

For the dance that follow­
ed, tables were covered in 
white with blue streamers. 
Colorful balloons, pot plants 
and floral arrangements 
completed the setting. One 
special bouquet was shipped 
by Don and Bunny York and 
boys from Hilo, Hawaii.

Sharing hosting duties for 
the festivities were Gary Don 
and Cindy Babcock: Denny 
and Carol Babcock and 
Kenny and Linda Babcock of 
Groom and Vince and Joyce 
Barclay of Vega. Grandchild­
ren are Cody, Marci, Dusty, 
Buck, Gint, Karen and 
Susan Babcock and T.J. and 
Kaci Barclay.

Out-of-town guests includ­
ed those from Pampa, Mr. 
and Mrs. J.M. McCracken, 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Eakin and 
Amy. Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Schaefers and Jenny. Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Maddox, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ken Burger, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dean Burger, 
Mr. and Mrs. Keith Davis 
and grandsons Dave and 
Ryan. Mr. and Mrs. BUI 
Ragsdale, Mr. and Mrs. 
Doyle Smith, Dr. and Mrs. 
Keith Black, Mr. and Mrs. 
Matt Street, Vemon Bagger- 
man, Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
Schaffer and Vi Dunham.

From Amarillo were Roy 
Lee Brown, Dr. and Mrs. 
John Albracht, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gene Collins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Stoemer, Kalli and 
Chad, Mr. and Mrs. Steve 
Britten and Frances Cannon.

Other guests were Mr. and 
Mrs. J.R. Porter. Mr. and 
Mrs. Freddie Reck, Gaude; 
James Britten, Shannon Paul 
and friend Dawn McGolden, 
Oklahoma: Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Britten, Mr. and Mrs. Dan 
Farley, Garendon: Connie 
Crowell, Perryton; Mr. and 
Mrs. Dennis Meador. 
McLean; from Michigan, 
Tommy Britten. And a host 
of relatives and friends from 
Groom, Grandview and the 
surrounding area.

Shelley Ann Barnett 
Weds David Britten

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Barnett Britten of Garendon. 
announce the engagement The couple plans an 
and approaching marriage of August 16 wedding at the 
their daughter. Shelley Ann Immaculate Heart of Mary 
Barnett to David Lee Brit- Catholic Church in Groom, 
ten, son of Mr. and Mrs. Bill

a traffic hazard.

Please co-operate and keep our streets safe.

See Us for

Lawn & Garden 

Supplies
Potting Soil 8 qt.
Tomato Food 
Rose Food 4 lb.
General Purpose Plant Food, 4 lb.
Turf Magic Super Lawn, 40 lb. Bags 
Turf Magic Weed N Feed, 40 lb. Bags 
Malathlon, qt.
Malathion, Gal.
5% Sevin Dust, lb.
5% Sevin Dust, 4 lb.
Liquid Sevin, Qt.
Fire Ant Killer
Spectricide Garden Insect Dust, 4 lb.
Diazanon Gran, 10 lb.
Spectricide 33t Weed Killer. Pint

See these fine products and many more for all you lawn and garden 
care needs at one location, see us.

Groom Wheat Growers
101 W. Front 248-2161

TTTlTrTTTT'i'T,,i,TTTTTTT,rTTTTTTTTTVITT,,i^Exl



Page 4—THE GROOM NEWS 
Thursday. June 5,1986

Mechanic On Duty 

State

Inspections

Fu ll serviee station-

There was talent galore
the last day of school as 
teachers Annetta Childress. 
Cheryl Gillispie and Susan

Bürgin acted out 
Billy Goats Gruff.” Pam 
Hutsell, no! shown, played 
the part of the Ogre.

CoUb Downs did his part 
for the third grade’s rock 
band.

Blackwell Service Center
Open 7:30 a.m. to 5:00p.m. 

248-2811

DEAN'S p h a r m a c y
2217

We look forward to serving 
our Groom area customers.

A sk about our mail service.

Welcomes 
Welfare Receipients

Special Discounts to Senior 
Citizens on all Prescriptions.
Dean Copeland lim T. Pepper
Home 665-2698 Business 669-6896 Home 669.9710

Con
Angie 

a song.

■
W a g  c g r a i n , in 1C
Lark 

®- 248-2551
Groom

248-6511

Seviir
the general purpose insecticide 
in Hie form you need

for lawns & 
gardens, 
from  
Purina1

$1*50 Field W Farm PlusQ j. p Coupon in every marked bag
for Purina Products

“ Trademark of Union CarbtdeCo tftPCo 1986

Scholarships Awarded 
GHS Graduates

Principal Kenneth Sweatt 
presented special awards to 
1986 Seniors during gradua­
tion exercises Friday at the 
School Auditorium. AO selec­
tions for special awards and 
scholarships to seniors are 
made by the high school 
faculty and administration.

Melissa Fields, class Vale­
dictorian, received that 
award in addition to the State 
National Bank award which 
is based on citizenship, 
athletic ability and scholar­
ship. She was also selected to 
receive the Most Outstand­
ing Girl award for citizen­
ship, scholarship and 
service.

Robbie Kuehler received 
the SaJutatorian award and 
the S.S. Scott Scholarship 
based on citizenship, post 
secondary aspirations, 
leadership and service.

Tim Weinheimer was reci­
pient of two awards. He was 
named the Outstanding Boy 
of the class presented for 
scholarship, citizenship and 
service. He also received the 
Parent Teacher Organization 
scholarship based on post 
secondary aspirations, 
citizenship, leadership and 
service.

Lindy Kotara was given 
the Eldred N. James 
Memorial Scholarship award 
based on citizenship, leader­
ship. post secondary aspira­
tions and service. She was 
also the third highest ranking 
student, receiving that award 
as well.

The Future Farmers of 
America Scholarship was 
presented to Tim Case. The 
award is made based on post 
secondary aspirations, 
citizenship, leadership and 
service. Consideration is also 
given to work performed in 
agricultural fields.

Plumbing, Heating & 

Air-Conditioning
Fast Repairs Everyth«« \A (?> 

-Sewer Lines ¿ f t
• Leaky Faucets -Roto-Rooter Service

Sandlin Plumbing
________ 883-8111 or 883-5561

Groom Feed & Implement 
Groom, Texas 

Garrison Seed Dealer 
SG 688 
SG 677

Red Top Cane Seed Dekalb 
DK 42y

Maize Seed

DK46

L M K D M

Check with usfor all your 

Hardware Needs!

GROOM HARDWARE 8 LUMBER
Groom, Toms

STOP N SHOP
South of Dairy Queen

248-3801 Homemade
Sandwiches

»

Fresh Daily

Flavor Crisp

Fried Chicken
by tho piece

or by the bucket
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William Hayes Speaks At Graduation; 
Junior High Exercises Held Friday

Graduation ceremonies for 
McLean’s Junior High stu­
dents were held on Friday 
night at the High School 
auditorium.

In the Valedictorian's add­
ress. Kim Orrick thanked the 
parents, teachers and friends 
who helped the students 
during their Junior High 
years. She said, "We have 
shared many memories we 
will cherish. We wish to 
thank our parents, teachers 
and friends for being there 
when times were tough. 
What we have gained in 
Junior High will prepare us 
for High School."

Salutatorian Damns Wat­
son echoed those sentiments 
in her address. She said, 
"We have had a great deal of 
fun and some iisrd times. 
Our teachers taught us res­
ponsibility and respectability 
for ourselves and others. We 
have established ourselves 
as winners and have learned 
that we can accomplish more 
with others that we can by 
ourselves.”

Dorman Thomas, Elemen­
tary School Principal, re­
viewed the history of the 
class, saying that 5 of its 
members began in Kinder­
garten the year he became 
principal.

Certificates were present­
ed by Jake Hess and Jacque 
Riley. The members of the 
1986 graduating class were: 
James Armbrister; Connie 
Jean Barker, Jill Brown, 
Darryl Foster, Mari French, 
Stacie Hail, Donald Harris, 
Tres Hess. David Hauck. 
Suzie Kunce, Johnny Lang­
ley, Cheri Layfield, James 
Martin, James McClellan, 
Kim Orrick, Tammy Pass- 
more, Alicia Reynolds, Billy 
Roltison, James Wall, Danna 
Watson and Loree Woodard.

The processional and 
recessional were played by 
Bobbi Stalls. Ida Hess direct­
ed the class in a performance 
of “ Making Our Dreams 
Come True."

Ushers were Melissa 
Thompson, Cash Carpenter, 
Missy Young and David 
Johnson.

High School Commence­
ment Exercises for McLean’s 
Seniors were held Friday 
night at the First Baptist 
Church.

The Invocation was given 
by Melanie Billingsley.

In the Salutatory address. 
Bob Patman said, "The class 
has been one of loving, 
caring friends.” In speaking 
of the parents, teachers and 
friends in the audience, he 
said, ‘‘There is not one 
among you who hasn't affec­
ted our lives.”

Wendy McDowell, giving 
the Valedictory address, 
called her fellow graduates 
"The class that can." She 
said, "The word that deter­
mines our success is "can.” 
Success is never final and 
failure is never fatal. We 
shall take the high way and

shall conquer the moun- 
n of life.”
Presentation of awards 
is given by Principal Pete 
iteman. Valedictorian 
endy McDowell received a 
holarship from the McLean 
achers Association and the 
ras State Teachers Assoc 
lion. She also won the C.R. 
nilo Mallison Scholarship. 
Bob Patman, who also got 
scholarship from the Texas 
ate Teachers Association, 
as the winner of the Madge 
ige Scholarship. This 
vard is given to the student 
ho shows the most merit, 
adership qualities, citizen- 
lip and participation in UIL 
id other activities. Patman 
lid he would share the 
holarship, which psys 5-500 
it semester, with Wendy 
IcDowell.

Jim Ridgway, who ranked 
third in his class this year, 
won a S150 scholarship from 
Beta Sigma Phi and a S150 
scholarship from the McLean 
Volleyball Association.

Final Honor Rolls 
Of Year Published

The Carl D. Henley Scholar­
ship, was given to Russell 
Littlefield. It will provide 
5100 per semester for as long 
as he attends school.

O. William Hayes, the 
owner of an Amarillo adver­
tising firm, was the guest 
speaker. He encouraged the 
graduates to "have some 
goals and have some 
dreams.” He said, “ If you w 
ant something out of life, you 
have to set a goal and then 
ask yourself how to reach it.” 
He said the key ingredients 
to success are "attitude and 
gratitude, determination and
cooperation.”

Diplomas were presented 
by Superintendent Jim Ruth­
erford and School Board 
President Joe Magee. The 
members of the 1986 grad­
uating class were: Kirk And­
erson. Vicki Armbrister, 
Amy Barnard. Melanie Bill­
ingsley. Chet Bohlar, David 
Campbell. Martin Gately, 
Billy Langley. Russell Little­
field. Wendy McDowell, Bob 
Patman. Connie Rawlings, 
Jim Ridgway. Donnie Smith, 
Lee Ann Tate and Kristie

he end of the ceremon- 
the Benediction was 
by Lee Ann Tate.

processional snd 
iional were played by 
Haynes and Ida Hess, 

class song "Friends” 
irected by Ida Hess.

The final honor rolls for 
the year have been issued by 
McLean schools.

Those who have main­
tained a grade point average 
of 90 and above for the entire 
semester are: 

Scolan-Melanie Billings­
ley, Wendy McDowell. Bob 
Patman and Kristie Thomp­
son

Jnalore-Le Milam and Kim 
Wiginton •

Sophomores-Angie ?ey- 
nolds and Cindy Thomas 

Frrehnw-Dollie Haynes, 
Tiffany Lopez and Karen 
Williams

Those who maintained an 
average of 80 and above for 
the entire semester are: 

Senior*-Vickie Armbrister, 
Russell Littlefield, Connie 
Rawlings. Jim Ridgway and 
Lee Ann Tate 

Jmlore-Jennifer Brown, 
Shawn Crockett, Billy Beck, 
Dan Fish, Angie Glass, Cin­
dy Hembree, Colleen Orrick, 
Angie Purcell, Jem Ann 
Rice and Dedra Watson 

Sophomoreo-Jim Bob Ad­
ams. Jim Anderson, Terri 
Lee, Linda Reid, irey 
Carey Richardson and Robert 
Tidwell

Freohmcn-Dale Barker. 
Geenie Kunce. Darla Mc- 
Anear. Misty Magee, Kara 
Tate, Kyle Woods, Skyla 
Bryant and Kimberly Kelling 

Those who maintained an

average of 90 or above for the 
final sii weeks are:

Seniors-Melanie Billings­
ley, Wendy McDowell and 
Kristie Thompson 

Jaadore-Dan Fish. Angie 
Glass, Colleen Orrick, Angie 
Purcell and Kim Wiginton 

Sophomore* Angie Rey­
nolds and Cindy Thomas 

Freahmeo-Dollie Haynes, 
Misty Magee and Karen 
Williams

Eighth grade-Tres Hess, 
Kim Orrick and Danna Wat­
son

Seventh gndo-Kathy Kell­
ing

Sixth grade-David Johnson
Fifth grade-Patsy Barker,

Holly Hefley and Quillian 
Rutherford

Fourth grade-Joetta Bai­
ley. Erin McCracken, Tom­
my Pennington, Doug Pur­
cell and Nathan Sullins 

Third grado-Karen Brass, 
Penny Lee, Jennifer Jones 
and Tonia Webster

Second grade-Jessica An­
derson, Jamie Barker, 
Heather Hess and Shelly 
Holland

First grade-Enn Gibson 
and Kristi Tidwell 

Those who maintained an 
average of 80 and above 
during the final six weeks 
are:

?refers-Vicki Armbrister,

See Honor Roll, pj>

Lion’s Club Journey for 
Sight Raises $500

The annual McLean Lion's 
Club Journey for Sight was 
held last Saturday. A total of 
29 participants made the 10 
mile walk to raise money for 
blind and visually impaired 
individuals.

Those recording the best 
times among the men were 
Dan Passmore, with a time of 
1 hour and 52 minutes; 
Destry Magee, whose time 
was 1 hour and 54 minutes; 
and Tanner Hess, who made 
the journey in 1 hour am] 55 
minutes.

Among the women, Mindy 
Jo Magee recorded the top 
time of 2 hours and 28 
minutes. Second was Kay 
Magee, with a time of 2 
hours and 52 minutes. Third 
place was taken by Kristie 
Thompson, with a time of 2 
hours and 56 minutes.

The trip began at 8:37 a.m. 
on Saturday morning. The 
last entrant crossed the fin­
ish line approximately four 
hours later.

Lion's Club member John­
nie Haynes reports that over 
$500 was raised. All partici­
pants will try to collect all 
pledges by the end of this 
week. For those who have 
pledged money, if you are 
not contacted by tomorrow, 
you are encouraged to get in 
touch with a member of the 
Lion's Club so your donation 
can be received.

In addition to those men­
tioned above, others who 
completed the 10 mile trek 
were Zelda McClellan. Mar­
vin Passmore, Kristina Car­
ter, Heidi Syfrett, Jennifer 
Pennington. John M. 
Haynes. Tommy Pennington, 
Stacie Smith, John C. 
Haynes. Billy Wilson, Nona 
Turpin, Heather Hess, Misty 
Magee. Nancy Simpson, 
Linda Haynes. Dollie 
Haynes, Kathy Carter, 
Shawn Crockett, Sam D. 
Haynes. David Johnson. Joe 
Riley, Sam A. Haynes and 
David Haynes.

The Lion’s Gub wishes to 
thank everyone who helped 
in any way and look forward 
to a bigger and better Jour­
ney next year.

Grandson of J. Boyd 
Smith Buried in 
In Shamrock

The infant son of Gary and 
Joy Cogburn passed away 
last Monday. Funeral ser­
vices were held in Shamrock.

Survivors include the par­
ents; maternal grandparents 
J. Boyd and Frankie Smith of 
McLean; and paternal grand­
parents Uoyd H. and Juanell 
Cogburn of Shamrock.
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Don’t Forget
The 50th Annual Alanreed 

Homecoming will be held 
this Sunday in the Alanreed 
g/m. Registration begins at 
11:00 a.m.

The McLean School Board 
will have its monthly meeting 
on Monday night at 7:00 
p.m. in the school business 
office.

The McLean Gty Council 
will meet on Tuesday night at 
7:00 p.m. at City Hall.

City Council Approves 
F lea Market Project and 
Christmas in July

The City Council met last 
luesday night to consider 
stveral issues which had 
been tabled at the previous 
Meeting.

Members in attendance 
»’ere George Green, Dr. 
Harold F. Fabian. Miro 
I akan and Martha Jo Bailey.

Others present were Mar­
tha Parker, Mrs. George 
i Jreen, Shirley Johnson, Stel- 
la Lee, Bob Glenn, Reverend 
und Mrs. Billy Wilson. Bess 
Edwards, Mr. and Mrs. Ver- 
non Turner, Mr. and Mrs. 
Oyde Holman, Dwight 
Brandt and Judy Munday.

In major items of business, 
the council:

-Heard a presentation 
from Shirley Johnson, school 
Business Manager, regard­
ing the collection of delin­
quent taxes. The council 
agreed to enter into a con­
tract with the school for the 
collection of these taxes. 
They will be submitted for 
collection by July 1.

-Listened to a proposal 
from Martha Parker that the 
city and school libraries be 
combined. School officials 
will have to receive approval 
before the merger can be 
made. The council agreed to 
accept the proposal provided 
approval from education 
authorities can be obtained.

-Heard a report from Mrs. 
George Green regarding the 
Christmas in July and Flea 
Market programs. The 
Christmas in July project 
would be sponsored by the 
Lion's Gub and Beta Sigma 
Phi. Mrs. Green said that she 
had talked to most of the 
business owners and they 
support the idea. The council 
gave its approval and ap­
pointed Mrs. Green as Chair­
man of the program.

Mrs. Green’s report re­
garding the use of the factory 
building as a Flea Market, 
was also approved. The 
council requested that the 
market be started as soon as 
possible.

-Approved the appoint­
ment of Ann Pierce, Tony 
Acuna and Dorothy Steel to 
the Housing Authority 
Board.

-Opened bids for the 
Water Grant Project. The 
contract will be awarded on 
June 10.

-Reviewed applications for 
jobs.

The next meeting of the 
Gty Council will be June 10 
at 7:00 p.m.
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Honor Roll
Amy Barnard. Russell Little­
field. Bob Patman, Connie 
Rawlings. Jim Ridgway and 
Lee Ann Tate 

Jonkm-Shawn Crockett, 
Billy Beck. Cindy Hembree, 
Clint Herndon, Mark McCar­
ty, Le Milam, Jem Ann Rice 
and Dedra Watson

Sophemares-Huey Green, 
Stacy Jackson. Judy Kenn­
edy, Terri Lee, Jeff Parker, 
Linda Reid, Davey Ridgway 
and Robert Tidwell

Fraahi tm-Dtle Barker, 
Cindy Coleman. Tiffany 
Lopez, Darla McAnear, Den­
ise Meaker, Wendi Smith, 
Kara Tate, Kyle Woods, 
Skyla Bryant and Kimberly 
Kelling

Eighth grade-Jill Brown, 
Mari French, Stacie Hall, 
Donald Harris, Suzie Kunce, 
Cheri Layfield, James Mc­
Clellan, Tammy Passmore 
and Alicia Reynolds 

Seventh grade-Cash Car­
penter, Hollie Hauck, J.T. 
Haynes. Lee Ayn Jordan and 
Melissa Thompson 

Sixth grade-Daniel Harris, 
Chris Littlefield. Des try 
Magee, Lisa McClellan, Tuf- 
fy Sanders, Richard Stilwell, 
Heidi Syfrett, Jason Thomas, 
Amy Williams, Becky Wilson 
and Missy Young 

Fifth grade-Peggy Adams, 
Michael Barker. Lee Hill, 
Becki McCarty. Vance Rod­
gers

Foarth grade Caryn Jor­
dan, Mindy Magee, Tiffany

una. Matt Hall, Angel Har­
ris, Holly Thompson and 
Jason Winegeart

Second grade-Justin
Brown, Seth Brown. Jennifer 
Pennington, Deana Phillips 
and Lee Shaw 

First grade-William All­
good, Derek Glass, Zack 
Helton. Tobey Purcell, Chad 
Richards, Tanna Shipman, 
Shandon Stalls and Rachel 
West

McLean Briefs

Two military helicopters 
had to make an emergency 
landing in McLean on Mon­
day. One of the aircraft was 
overheating and landed to 
make adjustments. After 
making repairs, the crews 
continued toward their desti­
nation in California.

Jake and Ida Hess went to 
Stillwater, Okla. this week­
end for an Oklahoma State 
University class reunion.

Jake and Lets Mae Hess 
are being visited by their 
grandson Stephen Hudson 
from Lubbock. Granddaugh­
ter Heather Hess also stayed 
with them during the week­
end.

Bob and Jeanette Fish 
were visited on Monday by 
her aunt and unde, Katy and 
Harold Churchill, from 
Oceanside, Ca.

Wendy McDowell left on 
Wednesday to attend college 
at Texas AdfeM.

Larry and Lynn Swanson 
recently returned from a trip 
to Arizona where they visited 
his parents and other rela­
tives.

Mr. and Mrs. H. Milton 
Billingsley were in McLean 
for Memorial Day weekend 
so that they might decorate 
the gravesites of Zora's sev­
en relatives buried in Hill- 
crest Cemetery. They also 
conducted some business 
matters while in town.

The Alanreed-McLean 
Area Museum reports the 
following visitors during the 
past week: 4 from Amarillo, 4 
from minoia and 3 from 
Kentucky.

Services for Former 
Resident In Odosse

Services were held for 
Passo Pugh, 61, of Houston 
on Saturday, May 24 at West 
Odessa Baptist Church. Bur­
ial was in Sunset Memorial 
Gardens.

Mr. Pugh died in Hous­
ton after a lengthy illness.

He was born in McLean in 
1924. He married Freddie 
Johnson Oct. 18, 194S in 
Pam pa. He moved to Odesaa 
in 1954 and wan retired from 
Phillips spending 39 years 
with the company. He was a 
veteran of the U.S. Navy.

Survivors include his wife; 
three sons, Fred of Wash­
ington, D.C. Roy and 
Dennis, both of Houston; a 
brother, Glenn Pugh, 
Forsyth, Montanna; and a 
sister, Annie Ambler of 
Shamrock.

Stump and Jeremy Thomas 
Ik k d  grads Joshua Ac­

For Lamp Shades 
Lighting Fixtures 

Lamps, Clocks, O ft Items, 
Light Bulbs, Catling Fons 

ond Lam p Parts

—
Photo Processing

COME SEE US FIRST!

S&giits 

and Sights
107 N Cuyler 665-8341 

Downtown Pampa 
Bnghf Ideas For Your Home

[Country 
Corner

Texaco E«itNo.i42
779-2391 1-40 M cLean , T x .j

[Coll in Orders Welcome
Breakfasts - Lanches

Deli and Hamburgers

Gas Ice Diesel

Cold Drinks 
Coffee

Thank You!

.Open 24 Hours

Accident Report for 
Grey County

Captain Bob Russell, Dis­
trict Supervisor of the Ams- 
riilo Highway Patrol District, 
comprised of 31 counties, 
said, “ For the month of 
April, our troopers invest­
igated 7 fetal accidents, 70 
personal injury accidents, 
and 79 property damage 
accidents. There were 12 
persons killed and 10S per­
sons injured in these acci­
dents."

Sgt. Jim Powell of Pampa, 
said, “ In Gray county, our 
troopers investigated S per­
sonal injury accidents and 4 
property damage accidents 
in the month of April. No­
body was killed but 7 persons 
were injured in the acci­
dents.

Firmer * Home Admin 
Starts Now Program -

The Farmers Home Ad­
ministration office in Wheel­
er will begin immediately to 
participate in “Operation 
Assist.” John D. Wolf ID 
County Supervisor, announ­
ced today.

Operation Assist it a new 
effort by FmHA to help 
farmers obtain guaranteed 
operating loans. County Sup­
ervisors for FmHA will take 
completed farm credit appli­
cations to local banka or 
other lenders, along with the 
farmer wishing to apply for a 
guaranteed loan.

“ We will handcarty the 
applications, and personally 
introduce the applicants to 
our local lenders,” said 
Wolf. “ We will present a 
complete loan package, in­
cluding cash flows, financial 
statements and appraisals. If 
necessary, we will make a 
commitment to work with the 
lender to do an interest 
buydown. We will do every­
thing we can to help the 
lender, and the borrower, by 
committing to guarantee the 
loan at our maximum 90 
percent.”

While direct operating 
loan funds are used up in 
some areas, there is still 
nearly S800 million available 
for the guarantee program. 
County FmHA officials hope 
other lenders will make oper­
ating credit available under 
the guarantee, with moat of 
the paperwork done before­
hand fey FmHA. '

Borrowers and lenders in­
terested in an FmHA guaran­
teed loan should contact the 
FmHA office.

Summer Reading Program 
Begins At Lovett Library

The summer reading pro­
gram for kids began yester­
day at Lovett library. Ses- 
stons will be held each 
Wednesday at 10:00 a.m. 
until July 16.

The theme of this year’s 
program will be “ Celebrate 
Texas.” Each week, partic­
ipants will be shown s movie 
about Texas and will be 
required to read supplemen­
tary material on Texas his­
tory.

Upon completion of the 
course, students will receive 
a certificate signifying that 
they have successfully com­
pleted the prescribed read- 
ing.

In addition, there will be a 
Bookmark Contest in which 
the participants will design 
their own bookmarks pertain­
ing to the “ Celebrate Texus” 
theme. Two winners for each 
library in the Panhandle wifl 
be selected. The winning 
designs will be sent to Ama­
rillo where they will be 
reproduced in packets and 
given out at the library booth 
at the Tri-State Fair.

The program, which is 
sponsored by the Texas State 
Library Association and Lov­
ett library, is for children 
from pre-school age and up. 
It is designed to encourage 
and develop reading skills.

Kay’s Video Rentals
4»
Next to Foshee’s Texaco 

779-2808
Mon-Sat.- 1:00 - 7:00 p.m.

COSUKTICS

For Complimentary 
Facial or Interview 

Call: 779-2102

J l in d a .  < S. tzA d e a d o r
Beauty Consultant

Box 124 - McLean, T x .79057

Ridgway 
Construction
'Remodeling Specialist'

Kitchons, Bathrooms, Additions, 
Coiling, Tile, Stool A Vinyl Siding

17 Years Experience
Cal! Wendell 779-2702 

McLean, Texas

NOTICE OF RIGHT TO NOMINATE BY re n n O N

s W e & r a a r m ’s g S S g j Scompletion can be obtained from your local FmHA office.

which activities T  CoaBty
the principal part r f  ^  “ * a r ™  out- d«ri' re
percent of their gross income must come ** morc thmn ^
a citizen of the United States or L  a l i e n ^ ^ ^ “ Hta^ 1J? rodUi.Cti0n)’ ** 
States for permanent residence, not h a v e i ^ H  ‘°  '  United
loan, and be well qualified for commits!! F^ A i?*ured *  gu*™nteed 
received in Wheeler FmHA offir. “ i**“  * ork- Nominations must be
rommittee elections are open tê eU|riMrv̂ .,Û i0, 1986 FmHAcolor, religion, nationalorigin, ^  re8“ d *° **“ ’
sex, and/or handicap. * 8 ’ p  ̂ ,lc* «ffliation, marital status.



Nursing Home News

Stella Gibson is in the 
High Plains Baptist Hospital 
and Leone Steed is is Sham­
rock Hospital. We wish them 
both a speedy recovery.

McLean Care Center wel­
comes a new resident, Del- 
phia Carpenter from Mc­

Lean.
Sunday, Brother Gerald 

Beasley, of the Church of 
Christ, was here to conduct 
services."

Monday morning, r>-xi- 
dents attending Memorial 
Day services were Lula Shee- 
gog. Leon Burch and Lona 
Jones. In the afternoon, resi­
dents playing bingo were 
Annie Eudey, Grace Swal­
low, Inez Fields, Ruth Kemp, 
Dick Wheeler. Fay Wilson, 
Leon Burch, Earl Tolleson, 
Teresa Richardson, Frank 
Reeves, Alice Dickinson, 
Stella Gibson, Kittie Hessey. 
Lucille Cullison and Elsa 
Stalls. Our helpers were 
Buna Gudgel. Cliffie Heas- 
ley, Onie Gibson, Annie 
Herndon, Bertha Smith, Mil-

and Marie

B & B ELECTRIC
Sales, f t n s  i  Service

LOYD BYBEE
Bus. 779-3252 
Res. 779-2517

SERVICE ON ALL MAKES OF APPLIANCES 
ELECTRIC WORK HEATING AND 
TV. ANTENNAS AIR CONDITIONING 

AUTHORIZED SEARS SERVICE TECHNICIAN 
Bu*. 779-3262/PO Box 284/McLean, Texas 79057

dred Giesler 
Reeves.

Tuesday, Lena Carter, 
Brenda McLain, Mary Davis 
and Ted Robertson were here 
to assist the following resi­
dents in dominos: P.L. Led- 
gerwood, Inez Fields, Leon 
Burch, Lula Sheegog, Dick 
Wheeler Grace Swallow, 
Stella Gibson, Ruth Kemp, 
Elsa Stalls, George Latta, 
Thelma Hopkins, Lona Jones 
and Teresa Richardson.

Wednesday morning, Ger­
ald Beasley and the ladies’ 
Bible class were hirre for a 
fellowship. Refreshments 
were served by the ladies.

Thursday morning, a resi­
dent council meeting and 
“ Rap” session was held. 
Residents attending were Lu­
la Sheegog, Dick Wheeler, 
Elsa Stalls. George Latta and 
Annie Eudey. Cookies were 
served following the meet­
ing. In the afternoon, Ted 
Robertson was here to assist 
the residents in dominos.

Friday, Martha Parker was 
here to show movies

Former Resident to 
Retire In Abilene

Herman L. Petty, of Abi­
lene, retired on May 31, 
1986, as an Elementary 
Counselor for the Abilene 
Independent School Dis­
trict's Lee Elementary 
School. Herman was honored 
on May 12 at Abilene High 
School as one of three coun­
selors retiring at the end of 
this school year.

On May 13. all retirees of 
the AISD system were honor­
ed at Abilene High School. 
Herman again was honored 
there, having a total of 24 
years with AISD with over 21 
of those years being as a 
certified counselor.

Herman graduated from 
McLean High School in 1939, 
along with his twin brother 
Harold, who retired May 1.

Herman graduated from 
Wayland Baptist Junior Col­
lege in 1941. His further 
education at Hatdin-Sim- 
mons University in Abilene

Our “ Family Night" Bar-, was interrupted for 3 years 
B-Q will be held Friday, June when he served in World

Simpson Agency
McLean, Texas

h  06 N. Main fOON I mVMW] 779-2451

Buy Your Home Insurance From 
An Experienced Agency Who Will 
Be Here W hen You Have A Loss.

(See Us For Homeowners Insurance 
j With Replacement Cost Coverage.’

6, at 7:00 p.m. Following the 
dinner, the public is invited 
to attend our entertainment 
and a White Elephant auc­
tion. Proceeds from tile auc­
tion will go to the Residents 
Activity Fund.

A clothing store in Georgia 
haa run an ad in tha same 
place in its local news­
paper since 1889.

F

“ Wal, Jake, we have never made any money on 
this ole ranch, but at least It’s been steady!”

BANK OF 
COMMERCE

A  S u bs id ia ry  o f G ra yC o  BancShares, Inc.

V9-246J ■ M cLean, Texas
5

'MCLEAN LODGE 
NO. 889 

A F -A M

Stated Meeting 
2nd Thursday 

Practice Every Thursday 
7:30 p.m.

VISITORS WELCOME 
Olin J. Weldon. W.M.
J. Boyd Smith, Secretary

Honor Roll

Rose Steel and Terri Glass 
of McLean were included on 
the Dean's List for the Spring 
1986 semester at WTSU. 
Both maintained a grade- 
point average of 3.5.

To be considered for the 
Dean’s List, a student must 
achieve a semester GPA of at 
least 3.25 with a class load of 
at least 12 semester hours.

Students whose averages 
are 3.85 or better are includ­
ed on the President’s list.
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PRINTING

The McLean News 

Call

779-2141

Richardson Texaco
24-Hour Road Service
Keel Cab«uba4i COdnOidAMr ú a  » en rice  »Timon 

Track A Tractor Hats

M9 W. 1st.
McLeso TX.

TEXACO
Home-779-3231 
Bus-779-2798

War B. In 1947, Herman and 
his wife, June graduated 
from HSU. He graduated 
from Southwestern Baptist 
Theological Seminary In 
Forth Worth in May 1951.

Prior to being employed 
with AISD, Herman and 
June served as foreign mis­
sionaries with the Southern 
Baptist Convention in Naza-' 
reth, Israel, for 9 years. Prior 

» to that, Herman had taught 
*in public schools in Balmor- 

hea, Tex. and Roacoe, Tex.
The Pettys are the parents 

of five children and 11 grand­
children. They plan to travel 
and visit their children. They 
will remain residents of Abi­
lene.

Herman is the son of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. Luther 
Petty of McLean and a twin 
brother to Harold C. Petty of 
Moberly, Missouri.

The Pettys have been very 
active in working with the 
International Residents 
through their church in Abi­
lene, Elmcrest Baptist 
Church.

SW A N SO N
Construction

Remodeling — Additions 

Concrete - Paneling ■ Roofing 

Call Larry at 779-3101 or 779-2950

; | * * * * : M * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * W * £

$£ o m h

O T o m u  S h o p
*  REDUCTION SALE
*  _  __ ___
*  '  V. to V, OFF
*  1009 N  Main 

’** ------• ---- ------ ******************************
-  Box 370 -  Phona 779-2611 #

McLean, Texas 79057 *

Buddy's Game Room
Roata 66 Wost McLean

Pool Toornomoot, video gemot, 
refreshments include Coke,

Pepsi end chips.

NO ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES 
SOLD OR SERVED

$K)0 p.m. -11:00 p.m. 
Monday-Saturday Closed Sundays

Don Miller Texas Restaurant
Radiator Service Noon Specials Every Day

Nota Sideline 
New A Rebuilt Radiatore

(Except Saturday)
Gae Toake A Heaton 

Repaired Monday - Saturday 
6:00 A.M .-8:00P.M .

612 S. Jefferson Sunday
Amarillo Texas 7:00 A .M .-2:00 P.M.

376-6666
■

779-8867 McLean

*
*

*
♦

♦
*

*
*

:
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Word -Miller To Exchange 
Vows On June 21

Kimberly Dee Ann Word 
and David Scott Miller will 
exchange wedding vows on 
June 21 at 7:00 p m. at the 
First United Methodist 
Church in Canyon.

The bride-elect, daughter 
of Mrs Jan Word and the 
late Lieutenant Commander 
Millard 1 Word, is a 1979 
graduate of Canyon High 
School. She is also a 1983 
graduate of West Texas State 
University with a B.S. degree 
in elementary education. She 
was a member of Mu Phi 
Epsilon, the WTSU Chorale. 
New Day Singers, and Kappa 
Delta Pi Honor Society. She 
is employed as a second

grade teacher with the Bush- 
land Independent School Dis­
trict. She is the granddaugh­
ter of Judge and Mrs. W R. 
Christal.

A 1980 graduate of Tas- 
cosa High School in Ama­
rillo, the prospective bride­
groom is the son of Mr and 
Mrs Ra\ Howard Miller of 
Rt . 1. west of Amanllo. He is 
the grandson of Mrs Beulah 
Hommel of Alanreed. and 
the late William “Ollie" 
Hommell. In 1983. he rec­
eived an A.A.S. degree in 
drafting and design from 
Amarillo College and is em­
ployed with the U.S. Postal 
Service.

Valuation Notices Being 
Sent By Appraisal Board

Certain propertv owners 
will be receiving valuation 
notices from the Gray County- 
Appraisal District on the 
proposed value of their prop­
erty. Charles Buzzard, chief 
appraiser for the district, 
said that only certain proper­
ty owners will be receiving 
these notices because of one 
of three <xcurrences which 
took place in the last year

First, if the property owner 
rendered his or her property, 
the appraisal district is re­
quired to send a notice of the 
proposed value placed on the 
property. Buzzard stated 
most of the renditions rec­
eived by his office were on 
business personal property. 
Property owners have the 
option of rendering their real 
estate Rendition is a means 
for a property owner to 
record an opinion of the 
property's value.

Second, if the property 
owner remodeled his proper 
ty or built any new structure, 
that property owner will rec­
eive a valuation notice. Buz­
zard said a notice will be 
sent if the proposed value is 
one thousand dollars or more 
than last year's value.

Finally, a property owner 
will receive a notice if the 
property is new in the dis­

trict. Valuation notices are 
sent to new businesses or 
mobile homes moved into the 
district as of January 1

Buzzard said that a tax 
payer who wants to lodge a 
protest of a proposed value 
must file a written ‘notice of 
protest " with the appraisal 
review board. The propertv 
owner must file the protest 
by June 30. Protest hearings 
by the appraisal review 
board begin on July 7.

Official forms for a notice 
of protest are av ailable at the 
appraisal office. "But a letter 
from the propen;, owner is 
also acceptable as a notice. ' 
the chief appraiser said, “ as 
long as it identifies the 
property owner and the prop 
ertv w hich is the subject of 
the protest and indicates 
dissatisfaction with some 
decision or action of the 
appraisal office."

A pamphlet is available 
from the appraisal distnct 
office explaining how to pre 
pare and present an appeal 
For more information about 
ARB heanngs. or the copy of 
the pamphlet. “ Taxpayers’ 
Rights. Remedies. Respon 
sibilities.” contact the Gray- 
County Appraisal District 
Office. 400 W Kingsmill. 
Suite 196-A. Pampa. Texas. 
665-0791.

Hartley Davis’ Enjoy 
64th Anniversary Party

Hartley and Mary Davis of 
Alanreed had a 64th wedding 
anniversary party at their 
home on Sunday.

Thev were married on May 
27. 1922. in Pampa Mr. 
Davis' parents moved to 
Alanreed in 1903. while her 
parents arrived in 1911 Thev 
have lived in Alanreed most 
of their lives. For a period of 
15 vears. thev lived near 
Pantex. where Mr Davis 
worked for Texas Tech as a 
herdsman for an experimen­
tal farm

Helping them to celebrate 
the occasion were their child 
ren Velma Hechler of San 
Antonio: John Davis, and his 
wife Julia, from Amanllo. 
Bet tv Brents of Amanllo; and 
Marie Mav. and her husband 
Willis, of Panhandle.

Other visitors dunng the 
day were Mr. and Mrs. 
Juster Hoff of Fntch; Ltnme 
Wilson of Fritch; Oren Dor­
sey; Nancy. Paula and Lisa 
Brents of Amarillo; Katie 
Hughes. Shirley Joyce of 
Clarendon; Herman and Lor- 
ene Tipton of Clarendon; 
Ellen Stapp of Groom; Doro­
thy Babitzk of Amarillo; Lena 
Carter; Mr. and Mrs. Ellis 
Stapp of Clarendon; Mr. and 
Mrs. Gerald Beasley; Bill 
Smith of Pampa; Margie 
Fish; Bertha Smith; Giffie 
Heasley; Bob and Jeanette 
Fish; Phyllis Hughes of Ama­
rillo; Patty Martin of Ama­
rillo; Rose Hall; Mike and 
Edwina Murphy of Amarillo; 
Jack Holt of Borger; and 
Debbie. Melissa. James and 
Justin Sitz of Panhandle.

Alanreed Briefs
A large crowd attended the 

end of school program at 
Alanreed School cafetonum 
last Thursday night. A skit 
was put on by all the classes, 
portraying the school and its 
studies, mostly history.

Eack teacher acknow 
ledged her students and 
presented them with ach­
ievement certificates and 
promotion slips PTO Presi­
dent Becky Myers presented 
the teachers with gifts. The 
one graduating Kindergarten 
student. Mark Olsen, was 
given a Longhorn I-shirt. 
Presiding over the present­

ations were Superintendent 
Hills Bob Adams. Sid Keese. 
School Board Vice-president. 
1^0 President Beckv Myers 
and the teacher

I he benediction was given 
b\ sixth grader Kirk Webb. 
Refreshments were served 
In the FR).

The Alanreed Homemak­
er's Club met on May 28th in 
the home of Ruth McLain. 
Lena Carter presided over 
the business session. Scrip­
ture. from Matthew 7:12. 
was read by Anita Bruce. 
Roll call was what Lena 
Carter calls “ poisons I have 
in my house" and was an­
swered by Anita Bruce. Lena 
Carter. Mary Davis. Nell 
Keese. Rose Hall. Tammy 
Haynes. Lucy Goldston. Don­
na Brauchi and Ruth and 
Brenda McLain. Donna gave 
a program on “ Fashions and 
Me. " Refreshments of crack­
ers and cheese spread, coffee 
and tea were served by the 
hostess. One guest. Ike 
Haynes, was present.

Visiting Lena Carter on 
Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Carter of Pampa. They 
had been at Greenbelt Lake 
celebrating grandson Wes­
ley’s second birthday.

Robert Bruce was in Bor­
ger on Wednesday.

Visiting the Hanley Davis' 
is daughter Velma Heckler of 
San Antonio.

The Olin Weldons were in 
Borger on Thursday to cele­
brate their grandson’s grad­
uation.

Keyes Pharmacy

"SERVICE YOU CAN TRUST"
Complete Convenient

Prescription Service .Mailing Service 
Competitive Prices 

and Drive-Up Window

Merlin Rose 
Pharmacist, Owner 

EMERGENCY NUMBER 669-3559
24-llour Emergency Service 

928 N. Hobart. 669-685‘) Pampa

ts available at your local
Groom Wheat Growers, Inc.

Groom, Texas (248-2161)
LARVACIDE is a re9^J®r®4 tradem ark of Sow eco  Inc. EPA  #21327-00004 

MVftCIDE is  a restr ic ted  use  pestic ide .

TREAT YOUR BURROW S WITH

LARVACIDE
U se  LA R V A C ID E  to  d r iv e  o u t a n d  k il l b u rro w in g  a n im a ls  s u c h  a s  rats, p ra ir ie  
d o g s , g o p h e rs , m o le s , w o o d c h u c k s  an d  g r o u n d h o g s  A  li t t le  d o e s  a lo t! 
D r iv e s  th e m  o u t to  d ie  M a n y  L a rv a c id e - t re a te d  b u r ro w s  m ay  fa l l in  fro m  
d is u s e  be fo re  they  a re  re o c c u p ie d  A n d  L A  RVACID E fu m e s  a re  h e a v ie r than  
a ir  s o  th e y  w il l l in g e r  in  fh e  b u rro w  U se  L A R V A C ID E  to  s o lv e  y o u r  b u rro w  
p ro b le m s !
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ALLSUP'S
CONVENIENCE STORES

DECKER GOLDEN, SALAMI, BEEF BOLOGNA 
P&P LOAF, SPICE LUNCHEON & BOLOGNA

LUNCH MEATS

79*8 0Z. 
PKG.

SUPPORT SPECULI OLYMPICS 
IT PURCHASII8 DECAER 
PRODUCTS AT ALLSUPS

DECKER

FRANKS

99 12 OZ. 
PKG.

DELICIOUS

$ 1 ° 9  W ß  CORN
d o g s  f  8 9 ç

ALLSUP'S 30 YEAR COMMEMORATIVE

MUG
FILLED WITH YOU FAVORITE 

FOUNTAIN DRINK

/

99
REFILLED FOR 49*

Kraft

Miracle Whip 

$ 1 3 9
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ALLSUP'S V i GAL. RND.

Ice Cream
$ - | 5 9

Cooked Food

Brisket Sandwich
Sliced

*1 1 9

Price Saver

Sugar *  1 1 9

5 lb. bag

Flamgo

Lighter Cubes 

4 9
2) ct. $ 1

Kleenex Family

Tissue $  j
250 ct.

Borden's Eagle Brand

32 ox.Jar
Sweetened Milk

PEPSI-COLA

Pepsi 

Diet Pepsi 
Mountain Dew

12 pk. — 12 cans
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Commissioners Set Fees 
For Sheriff's Office

The Carson County Square 
House Museum was well 
represented at last 
Tuesday's meeting of the 
Carson County Commission-' 
ers Court. Director Jim May,

Chairman of the Board of 
Directors. Jo Randel and 
Board members Ralph 
Randel. R.W. Standefer. 
Wilma McCrohan, Norma 
O'Neal, Betty Rhynehart and 
Bethel Robinson personally 
appeared to request that the 
county assist paying utility 
costs for the new education 
building.

Learn 

To Swim

Swimmer Advanced

Starting Jane 17

Swimming Lessons
8 Classes-$20.°°

Beginners (4 A older) Mom A Tot
3 A Under 
Beginner,

Contact B. Stephens at 
-248-6371 (home) 248 -4171 (pool)

Water Aerobics
Tuesday A Thursday 7:00-8:00 p.m.

Pay Per Session
Please Cal! I f  Interested.

SEE US FOR 
YOUR CORN & GRAIN 
SORGHUM SEEDS

We are the dealer for the following
N am e B rand  Seed

Dekalb Golden Acres

Pioneer Warner P.A.G.

Northrop King Richardson •

Abo Blocking Hybrid Sudan*,
Red Top Cane and Hegari

Call or coma by and reserve your 
SEEDS Now!

WEEKS &  BAGWELL GRAIN
Bob Byrd, Manager 

Be 1 Groom Pbone 248-5591

EXPEB^

BELTS YOU LOOK YOUR BEST!

One Hour Martinizing
Bring your cleaning when 

you shop in Pam pa...

Pick it up the same day!!!

Two locations to serve you

1807 N. Hobart-1824 W. Francis

Recent major contributions 
from Sen. Grady and Mrs. 
Adrine Hazlewood, the M.K. 
Brown Foundation in Pampa 
and Lawrence Hagy and 
friends, brought the fund for 
the educational center to 
within S5.9S7.76 of the pro­
jected costs for the building.

The group from the 
Museum requested that the 
county’s contribution would 
not exceed $6,000 per year 
for utilities. On a motion 
from Commissioner Jones, 
the item was tabled until the 
time when commissioners 
begin study of the new 
budget for 1986-87.

A hearing was then held 
concerning applications to 
theTexas Department of 
Community Affairs for the 
Texas Community
Development Grant monies. 
A second hearing was set for 
the regular commissioner’s 
court meeting on June 9.

Several items concerning 
the Sheriff’s Department 
were acted on as follows:

° Salaries for future em­
ployees will be consistent 
with policy now affecting em­
ployees in that office.

° Civic Process Fees were 
reviewed and will remain the 
same, S5.00 for posting 
notices, written notices and 
jury fees.

° Small Claims fees were 
left at the price of S10.00.

° An additional $5.00 
charge was added to all other 
service fees which will now 
be $25.00 for serving cita­
tions, subeonas, etc.

Also discussed by the 
Court was granting of water 
rights to the City of Skelly- 
town. The county will do 
research to determine what 
steps will be necessary to 
secure the rights on the site 
in question.

Fm HA Seeks County 
Committee Members

Eligible Farmers in Car- 
son, Potter and Randall 
counties are invited to 
become noninees for the 
Farmers Home
Administration County 
Committee, FmHA County 
Supervisor Jim Black an­
nounced this week.

As a result of the 1985 
farm bill, two of the three 
members of FmHA County 
Committees must be elected. 
The third member is appoint­
ed by FmHA. The Carson, 
Potter Randall Area County 
Committee assists the FmHA 
county office in reviewing 
applications for FmHA form 
loans and on other form 
credit matters.

Generally, farmers who 
are residents of the county 
but not FmHA borrowers are 
eligible to become nominees 
for the FmHA county 
committee.

For this first election only, 
two members will be elected 
at the same time. One will 
serve a one year term of 
office and othe other will 
serve two years.

In the future, all terms of 
service will be for three years 
each on a staggared basis.

Nominating petitions must 
be returned to the FmHA 
Amarillo county office by 
June 10.

Additional information and 
application forms for those 
who are interested in becom­
ing nominees for the county 
committee are available at 
the FmHA county office, 
3002 East 3rd, Amarillo, Tx. 
79104 or by calling 376-2271.

Alpha Mu Xi 
Installs Officers

Alpha Mu Xi met May 8th 
in the home of Laura Britten 
for their last meeting of the 
year.

Officers for the coming 
year were installed. They are 
Nita Jackson, president; Ber- 
nie Tyrrell, vice president; 
Evelyn Schaffer, treasurer; 
Barbara Homer, correspond­
ing secretary and Margie 
Stephens, recording
secretary. New pledges, 
Laura Britten and Ila Miller 
were welcomed as members.

Plans were made for 
Groom Day include a raffle 
and float for the parade. The 
park committee reported 
they have plans to make a 
nativity scene for the park 
and work on it «dll be 
completed this summer.

Members signed for 
committees and Secret 
Sisters were drawn for the| 
coming year.

Those members enjoying a 
salad supper were Lorene 
Babcock. Ruby Babcock, Sue 
Britten, Donna Crump, 
Barbara Homer, Betty 
McCracken, Nancy Patter­
son, Evelyn Schaffer, Margie 
Stephens. Elaine Thompson, 
Bernie Tyrrell, Donna 
Wagner, Ila Miller and 
hostess, Laura Brittten. 
Betty McCracken won the 
door prize.

Elaine Thompson was pre­
sented her pin for being 
selected Girl of the Year for 
the sorority.

Britten Named 
To Honor List

Tracy Britten of Groom has 
been named to the Dean's 
Honor List at South Plains 
College for the 1986 spring 
semester.

To qualify as an honor 
student at SPC, students 
must maintain a minimum 
3.25 Tracy main­
tained a 3.70 GPA for two 
years at SPC.

Bobby White Receives 
Master’s Degree In 
Business A t UT

Martin and Betty Hernies- 
meyer attended Commence­
ment exercises recently in 
San Antonio for their son, 
Bobby White.

Bobby received his Master 
of Business Administration 
degree from the University of 
Texas at San Antonio on May 
19. Jay Hess, Chairman of 
the Board for The Univer­
sity of Texas System, con­
ferred degrees to approxi­
mately 800 graduates.

Bobby is presently Senior 
Administrative Accountant 
for Diamond Shamrock 
Refining and Marketing 
Company. He has been with 
Diamond Shamrock for three 
years. Hr has held several 
positions Including Superior 
Refining Accounts Payable, 
Senior Refining Accountant 
and Pipeline Accountant.

Bobby is a 1979 Groom 
High School graduate. He 
received his Bachelor of 
Business Administration in 
accounting in 1982 from 
West Texas State University.

Mr. and Mrs. Hermes- 
meyer spent several days in 
San Antonio taking in the 
sites. Bobby accompanied 
them on a short trip to the 
Gulf Coast and Corpus 
Christi.

We don’t think there 

is a better place to 

haul your grain.

"  We appreciate the opportunity 

to se rve you."

WEEKS & BAGWELL 

GRAIN, Inc.
Bob Byrd, Mgr.

Phone 248-5591
Route 1 Groom

Groom Flying 

Service

Harris Howard

Sorry for the inconvenience!
While our phone was out o f  service.

We are glad that it is no w back in 
service. We regret any incon venience 
this may have caused our customers. 
Harris A Office Craig

248-4561 248-6311

POWER SAWINGS TIME

The best tractor 
deals in town just 
got better
Buy a new 
IUU- to IVO-hp 
John Deere now 
and pay no 
interest * until June

Right now we re deabng bke never before on pranary power John 
Deere tractors For starters, we re  p m n g  along tag factory dn- 
rounts -  that means huge savings on the se tng  price. And to 
sweeten the deal. John Deete w i  trance your new tractor 
interest free untd June 1.1966

Come on m and check out the new tractors m stock. Horsepower 
lor horsepower, feature lor feature. John Deere s got the tractor deals 
the competition can't match. And now the deals are even better. Stop 
m today

Blackwell Supply
248-2141 Groom
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COME READ WITH ME .
.Individualized reading 
instruction. Grades 1, 2 and 
3. (Special help for children 
who need help in reading) 
Man. thru Thura, 1 boor a 
dnjr. 16 sessions during the 
month of July. Taught by 
Stella Sherwood, 101 Euclid, 
Panhandle. Experienced in 
remedial reading. Please 
Call M6-537-3134 ar 866-537- 
35*1.

For Sale—Art Britten
Residence in Groom. Groom 
Realty, 248-4481.

--------------  for female
dispatcher/jailer for Wed­
nesday through Sunday, 5:00 
p.m. to midnight are being 
««cepted at the Carson 
County Sheriffs office in 
Panhandle.

Dog grsauliig-Al! sizes 
and breeds. Call Jeannie at 
779-2702. McLean.

Far tale-Boy's bedroom 
suite (4 pieces). Call 779- 
2239 after 5:00 p.m.

VMao’s Ready ta Wear, 
Flowers ft Gifts, Groom—
We will be closed Saturday, 
June 7, to participate in a 
market at Tuba, Tez. spon­
sored by the Chamber of 
Commerce there.

Janice Koetttag will do 
workshop Tuesday, June 17, 
8:30 a.m. to 12:00 noon. See 
finished piece at Rock House 
Gallery. Registration dead­
line is June 12.

i Feed *  Impl.minl
Groom Texas. 248-5721 Now 
Open—Bearings, belts and 
more. Come by to see us. 
C.L. Wiebr rg

WUto Deer DeKgfato cook­
books are on sale now at 
Groom News. $7.95 each 
with all proceeds to Xi Sigma 
Beta Chapter Beta Sigma 
Phi.

necklace—Texas with blue­
bonnets—$15.00. Cab Alice 
Wells 248-6451 Rock House 
Gallery/The Country Store.

needed at St. Ann's Nursing 
Home in Panhandle. Refer 

required, apply in

sale-Thursday 
through Saturday. 819 West 
3rd, McLean.

19B3 Conger for sale, 
$5,995. Call Larry Pool 
248-2201.

Fill your locker with choice 
BEEF and PORK from

Circle B Meat
Bill and Leon Bohr, Owners 

F M  Road 295 at W est City Lim its 
Phone 248-3321 Groom, Texas

Pay's Service
For yeor planting needs:

★  Pey wester
★  Teyler Evens

★  Richardson
Complete Line Of Tires & Service

Wholesale Deliveries
lletoil-Regelnr-Unleeded

Mon-Sot., 7:00 A M . to 6:00 PM :____

r  sale, two bed­
room with garage, extra nice, 
408 Clarendon in McLean. 
Call 779-2681 or 779-2618.

Far Sale oak rocker like 
new, $100; round end table, 
$2S; six corner end table with 
doors, $35. Call John Pat­
terson, 248-2011.

Far sale one, new J.D. 
20’ pickup reel, $650; one, 
Excel Tractor Cab, fits 4020 
J.D., $265; one, Maytag 
kitchen stove, 36", $160; 
one, used evaporative cooler, 
$190. Call 806-248-5721 or 
248-2071. Groom.
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.Carpentry 01
Accoustical Ceilings - Storm 

Cellars - Garage Àdditiona - 
Roofing. Cab Jim Burton 

248-3691,1

Weight
session starts Tuesday, June 
10, 1986 at 6 p.m., Metho­
dist Church in Panhandle. 
For more information. Cab
537-3393 or 537-3710.

WR de mtolMtog—no job
too small. RGM Ag ft Grain, 
Inc. 248-2551 or 248-3461 

• after 6:00.

Cfiam^eotain
HIGHWAY 287 CLARENDON, TEXAS 

BUICK • OLDSM08ILE 
PONTIAC • CADILLAC • G  MC TRUCKS

SUSAN BROWN 
248-6241
Groom, Texas 79039

Clarendon (806)874-3527 
Amaribo 376-9041 

Texas WATS (800)629-4088

See ear beautiful king size 
quilts. Lone Star and 
Wedding Ring patterns. 
Rock House Gallery/The 
Country Store.

SHOPTHE 
CLASSIFIED ADS

Yen’re attendance re­
quested at Sports Day Camp. 
Registration ends soon for 
June 10-14 camp. Cab Donna 
Burton, 248-3691 for details.

Light Bulbs, 
Replacement Glass 
~  > Of Shades

A. J. Newsom 
Water Well 

Service
Submersible Pumps 

Aeromotor Windmills

P hone 248-2711

for
this two bedroom house at 
309 Broadway. Cab after 6:00 
p.m. 248-3271.

Insurance and Family Sc 
Individual Cancer Insurance. 
Plans avabable at Brantley 
Insurance Agency 248-5561.

■In-Friday Only. 
511 West 3rd St„ McLean.

For all yew concrete and 
backhoe service, call Barker 
Redi Mix 779-2703 in 
McLean.

W add like to b^y 5 or 10
acres west or northwest of 
Groom. Close to a paved road 
248-5681. Contact J. David 
Brown.

fhaHst Cowls is no longer 
delivering the Amaribo 
Globe News in Groom. She 
will be collecting for all 
deliveries made prior to June 
1.

Why pay rent? Move into a 
beautiful home for less than 
you are paying in rent. 
Qualify by phone. Call collect 
(806) 381-1352, Abiance
Homes, Inc.

and in­
terior painting. Satisfaction 
guaranteed. Free estimates. 
Cab David Weber at 
248-2361 after 6:00 p.m.

CALL
Your local used cow dealer 
for seven day a week, dead 
stock removal. Phone 335-, 
2372 or 1-800-692-4435.

. ©

Tommy ft
Representatives

Mm h K O m Im U otaK O oM hd
190« W. 10th, P.O. Bos 200
Amarillo. TX 79100
Phons 372-3091. Ret 229-2051
Ufa. Hospitalization, Disability Income, Group

Annuries, IRA, Medicare, Accident, Cancer.

Canon County Abstract Company
REALTORS. ABSTRACTORS OF TITLES

222 M ain St. 537-3561
Panhandle, Texas

Far Sale 77 Pontiac 
Grand Prix. Gary Babcock, 
248-4803, Groom.

Hawse Far Sale By Own«, 
506 WOkarsan

Cab 248-6591 665-1172

TAKE UP PAYMENTS
One and Two Bedroom 
Homes. Qualify by phone 
(806) 381-1352. Call Collect. 
Alliance Homes.

¡’a

V AUTO — HOME — LOTS — MEDICAL 

ESTATE PLANNING — ANNUITIES 

BONDS — CROP HAIL — CANCER

Other

248-3691

Father’s Day cards and 
gifts ar Rock House Gallery .

|  of ■ praying trees
for bagwormsf Contact the 

professionals at RGM Ag ft 
Grain, Inc. 248-2551 or 
248-6511.

AD At

RATES

We personally service what we sell.

Irumley Insurance Agency
GR00II, TEXAS

Johnny Brumley, Agent 
Office: 248-5561 Home: 248-5561

1*1

WHEELER-EVANS 

ELEVATORS
Groom  &  C om er North  

W e are happy to be of service"

Phones 248-3161 or 2484771 
Corner-248-2611

248-3161 or 
248-4771

140*2111

Groom , Texas

248-2611
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Gourmet Chef In Charge 
Of Hospital Cuisine

EDITOR’S NOTE:The fol­
lowing article appeared in 
the Sunday Oklahoman 
(Oklahoma City) in April. Jay 
Cooper is the son of Mrs. 
Essie Cooper-Knowles and 
the late B.H. Cooper.

Author of the article is 
Louise B. James.

Jay Cooper has heard all

the horror stories about 
hospital food.

But this gourmet chef 
doesn't believe bad food and 
hospital cooking have to go 
together like. . .well, like 
bacon and eggs. He’s also 
food services director for the 
Woodward Hospital and 
Health Center, where he 
hopes patients find their 
meals a high point of the day.

“ Hospital food has been 
so institutionalized," he 
said. "It was cooked in large 
quantities. It was over­
cooked and without

seasonings.
“There's now an aware­

ness that for the patient or 
nursing home resident, 
about all they have to look 
forward to is the food."

If they are served bland, 
unattractive meals or food 
items they never eat, even 
when they are well, the day 
has been a disappointment 
and the stories about hospital 
cooking continue.

"We use garnishes so our 
food is attractive as well as 
good tasting,” Cooper said.

“ We cook semi-batch 
form, and patients order 
from selective menus for all

Judge

JIM BRADY
for Justice

TEXAS SUPREME COURT
■ . ■ m i  - 1 1  E  .... ........  'I .  " ,  i-U  1. u ' ' im ."' V I ,-a w

seven special diets we offer.
“ 1 consider our food ex­

cellent. It’s the same for 
employees and guests (in the 
hospital cafeteria). We’re 
always trying new things. 
Right now we have a mar­
velous taco salad on Thurs­
day for only $2.50.”

Cooking comes naturally 
for Cooper.

“ 1 was raised in the res­
taurant business,” he said. 
"It was a small town eating 
joint, but not a greasy spoon.

"By the time I was 6 years 
old, I stood on a tomato crate 
to turn pancakes in the morn­
ing. I came back from school 
at noon to work the lunch 
break.”

When he moved to
Bethany in 1965 to attend 
college, Cooper learned
“ mote elegant cooking,” he 
said. “ I began working for 
the Captain’s Table as a 
waiter and went to assist­
ant manager. ”

For the next several years. 
Cooper worked in some of 
the Oklahoma City area’s 
better restaurants as he

FOR LIVE NEWS 
FROM GROOM  

TRUST THE LONG RANGER.
O u t  of the distance in a roar of dust comes the 

newest hero on the news scene. Channel 10’s Long 
Range Live. Our crack news team covers all the news of 
the Panhandle. Live. When it’s happening. And that’s 
something no other station can do. When you want Pan­
handle news live, turn to Channel 10 and the Long Ranger.
It’s good news from the news good guys.

c H n n n E L  gyp r e l u s

LONG RANGE LIVE 
KFDA-TV

earned college degrees in 
psychology, business admin­
istration and hospital and 
nursing home administra­
tion.

He also learned to prepare 
flaming dishes such as 
cherries jubilee, to make 
specialties such as Caesar 
salad, and to use meats other 
than the old standards of 
beef and chicken, such as 
lamb and fish.

In 1980, he left Baptist 
Medical Center to assume 
the position as food service 
director in Woodward, where 
he helped plan the food 
service area for the new 
hospital. While these duties 
often keep him out of the 
kitchen, he lands a hand 
there if needed.

Cooper still dons his chef s 
hat for catered functions 
such as wedding receptions 
and company parties held at 
the hospital cafeteria. He will 
prepare the flaming items, 
the salads, the special 
entrees or the beamaise 
sauce.

“ I once cooked a nine- 
course French dinner for a 
party here," he said.

Such a party requires 
tablecloths, linen napkins, 
china, crystal and a waiter or 
waitress who "presents the 
meal," he said. This atmos­
phere of elegant dining is 
unavulable elsewhere
locally.

"It’s a very new idea to 
come to the hospital to eat a 
banquet,” he said.

Cooper also teaches an 
eight-week gourmet cooking 
class at the High Plains 
Vo-Tech School in Wood­
ward.

Students do all the pre­
paration in class. The 
emphasis is on meats, salads 
and vegetables since "most 
desserts take longer thnn the 
three hours we have in 
class,” he said.

The classes Itave an inter­
national flavor Each week 
Cooper uses food from a 
different country—Germany, 
England, France, China and 
the Soviet Union among 
others.

"They learn to use and 
prepare food with garlic, 
basics on French knives, how 
to cook with wine, how to use 
a wok.”  he said.

"They recently made chi­
cken Kiev from scratch.” 

Television chefs have a

complete staff that help off- 
camera for their classes, but 
"if we mess up in dass, we 
either eat it or it goes down 
the disposal,”  Cooper said of 
the hospital kitchen.

While cherries jubilee and 
chicken Kiev probably won’t 
be offered to hospital pa­
tients in the near future. Jay 
Cooper—the man behind the 
kitchen—believes good food 
does belong on those trays.

Librarians Dinner
Mrs. Barbara Sparks, Car- 

son County head librarian 
entertained the Carson 
County librarians last Thurs­
day evening,by taking them 
to Dyer’s for dinner. Those 
attending were Mrs. Sparks. 
Mrs. Jo Atm Smith. Mrs. Jo 
Nell Webber, Panhandle. 
Mrs. Bertha Knight, Groom, 
Mrs. Janette Cathey, White- 
Deer and Mrs. Barbara Bar- 
row, Skellytown.

GROOM LODGE 
No. 1170 

A.F.DA.M.

Stated Meeting,
2nd Tuesday 

Practice Every Tuesday 
7:30 p.m

VlSiTORS WELCOME

Oran Durham. W.M. 
Cecil Culver, Secretary

Wieberg

Welding

Field t  Shop
Wilding

Fabrication

t  Repairs, Heliarc

Wesco Supplier

Nathan Wieberg 
248-5721 

Shop & Home
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Corn & Milo Seeds.. .

★  Oro

★  Dekalb

★  Seed-Tec

★ Terra

★  Garst

★  NC4-

★  Northrup-King
I  Herbicides and Custom Application*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*

See Us —  We Deliver

^rc»isr«e
Groom 248-6511 l . ,k  24I-2J51
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