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HAPPY THANKSGIVING
W ork 

Begins On

Center
Groom E c o n o m ic  

Development Corporation 
■et Monday night in a 
ipeeitl called m eeting 

were Bill Homer.
Johnny Brumley.

; members at large, 
Martin H e rm esm ey e r 
Charlene W eller. Doris 
[Miller. Hop Britten 
1JW  Fields. Tony Tread- 

and Donna Burton. 
President Homer opened 

about the Higher 
■Had Program, explaining 
i* ■*rt,on to new mem 

••te Does are currently due 
* •  rate of $500 00. In past 
yian GEDC has paid 1/2 
•■d the city has paid 1/2. 
»  Brumley moved and Mr 
■wmesmeyer seconded to 

jW  1/2 the fee due to the 
P *  Ground Program, 
•he (notion passed. 

®Mcossion was opened on 
J h t  renovation on the 

•■tender of the community 
»«ler building. Needs 
Meatified were a large door 
•  the east side of the 
•adding, heating to be re­
done and additional wiring. 
Daring the work a large 
fcmpster will be placed (like 

city has) at the east of 
»he building. Work is 
•cheduled to begin on 
Saturday. November 24. The 
Wblic is invited to bring 
*beir hammers and help. 

jB I f r .  Brumley moved and 
■up Britten seconded to 
■■derwrite a revised version 
M the student directory 
being prepared by Doris 
Kuehier The cover is to be 
••designed. A directive was

run to keep the cost under 
00

^  A report was given by Bill 
Homer as to an inquiry 
®EDO had from a business 
Interested in relocating in 
Groom Mr. Homer and Mr. 
Lamb traveled to Amarillo to 
■eet with the owner of Palo 
Diiro Mattress Co. after a 
Wo hour discussion it was 
fcund that the company 
heeds did not meet with 
GEDC's resources, those 
being a 15.000 square foot 
building and S150.000.00 
■•secured loan, with a seven 
to ten year payback.

1 The meeting adjourned to 
inspect the building and 
further formulate plans.

Trooper Bob Visits Groom Students
G rad es  K in d e rg a rte n  

through Sixth Grade had a 
real treat Friday, November 
16. They were visited by 
Trooper Bud. a D.P.S. robot 
officer. Trooper Bud is a 
fully operation Robot that 
does educational programs 
statewide to teach children 
safety and drug awareness.

He spoke to Groom 
students about the import­
ance of using seatbelts even 
around town. Tobacco, alco­

hol and drugs were dis­
cussed. Jerry Burgtorf and 
Wayne Beighle, both D.P.S. 
officers, are responsible for 
bringing Trooper Bud to 
Groom. Officer Beighle 
stated that there are 12 
robots in the State of Texas 
used for this purpose. They 
cost $20,000.00 each. These 
educational tools were made 
possible by the Durill

County Investment Policy Reviewed 

Jail Found To Be In Complience
Carson County Commis­

sioners met in regular 
session on November 13, 
with all present.

The first item of business 
was a request for an ease­
ment to install a pipeline in 
Precinct #4 was approved. A 
request was made by 
Damson Gas Company. The 
Court also confirmed the 
installation of a communi­
cation line by G.T.E. in 
Precinct #1.

The State Treasurer in­
formed the courty by letter 
that $23,382.92 for the 
lateral road fund had been 
sent to Carson County. The 
revenue will be used for road 
maintenance in the County.

The court accepted a bid 
from West Texas Equipment 
Company to replace a year 
old 140 G. motorgrader with 
a new 140G. at no cost due to 
mechanical problems. The 
court appointed Agnes Bell 
to serve as Records Manage­
ment officer in order to 
comply with Title 6 Subtitle 
C. Local Government Code.

The Court accepted a bid 
from A.J. Weiser and Com­
pany for County property 
and General Liability 
Insurance. Total cost 
$16,949.00 per year.

Judge Roselius reported 
that the County Jail has 
been inspected in October 
and is in compliance with the 
standards set forth by the 
State Jail Commission.

The Court reviewed the 
County investment policy as 
well as the annual report of 
the financial operations of 
the county as submitted by 
the County auditor. It was 
agreed by the Court to place 
$200,000.00 of the County 
revenue in the White Deer 
Bank and $200,000.00 in the 
Groom Bank, and proper 
security would need to be 
furnished on the accounts.

The Court agreed to 
furnish a new tree to be 
placed at the historical 
Marker on Highway 60 west.

The Court reviewed and 
approved the County’s 
Reserve Officer Program for

Water I _ _
The repairs and additions 

to Groom’s Water System is 
progressing nicely and at 
rapid rate. The small incon­
veniences we all have or will 
experience will be worth the 
trouble when the project is 
completed. Residents from 
Main Street East will ex­
perience several water shut 
downs periodically some­
time in December. City 
officials have stated that all 
businesses will be notified 
the day before, and they will 
do their best to pass the 
word among residents. 
Water will be turned off at 
1:30 p.ip. and will be off 
until approximately 9:00 
p.m. This is necessary to tie 
new water mains into exist­
ing lines.

e tu d e s *

Couf»c‘l r

Foundation, which was set 
up by a man whose daughter 
was killed in a traffic acci­
dent. He wanted to teach 
other children to know about 
safety measures that might 
possibly save their life.

The children were invited 
to ask the robot questions at 
the end of the program and 
seemed to really enjoy the 
event.

Groom School Board met 
Tuesday, November 13, 
1990 in regular session. All 
members were present, one 
visitor, John Allen Homan.

Minutes from the previous 
meeting were read and 
a p p ro v e d . T ru s te e s  
approved the Annual Per­
formance Report which is a 
document reviewing the 
previous year’s educational 
p e r fo rm a n c e , s p e c ia l  
program evaluations, a 
general personnel evaluat­
ion profile, financial status , 
media activities, continuing 
curriculum changes and 
communications with the 
community.

The Board approved the 
1989-90 Texas Education 
Agency Accreditation Moni­
toring Report.

In other business, mem­
bers approved a Student 
Council sponsored dance 
slated for December 21. The 
rules for the dance will be as 
follows: (a) No one shall be 
permitted to leave and 
return while the dance is in 
progress, (b) The dance will 
begin at 8:00 p.m. and end

at 12:00 midnight, (c) Cost 
will be $5 per person (d) all 
students attending will be 
required to pay the $5.00 
fee. (e) Student Council 
Sponsors will not be 
required to pay, (f) no 
smoking or use of tobacco 
will be allowed, (g) No 
alcohol beverages will be 
allowed, (h) All students 
attending must abide by the 
Groom High School Dress 
Code or entry will be denied, 
(i) Dance will be held at St. 
Mary’s Parish Hall if per­
mission is granted by their 
governing board. 0) Attend­
ance will be permitted to 
Groom High School Students 
and students from other 
schools who have been pre- 
re&utefed w ith  an  officer o f
the Student Council prior to 
December 20.

The School Board also 
gave approval for the Senior 
Class members to partici­
pate in a fond raising project 
that is still in negotiations 
with the Conway Church.

Trustees approved paying 
all bills and the meeting was 
adjourned.

(Community Calendar
December 9, has been set 

as the date for the annual 
Holiday Dinner at the Groom 
Community Center.

1990-91 as presented by 
Sheriff Timmons.

The appointment of a 
member of the Carson 
County Appraisal Board was 
discussed.

Groom Basketball Action
can be witnessed November 
26 at Shamrock. Junior high 
players will begin play at 
4:00 p.m. with the Seventh 
Grade Girls, followed by 
Eighth Grade Girls and then 
Seventh Grade Boys and 
Eighth Grade Boys.

On November 27, 
Silverton Owls will travel to 
Groom. Basketball action 
will get underway at 5:00 
p.m. with the Junior Varsity 
Boys first on the court. 
Varsity Girls and Boys will 
follow.

The Miami Tournament 
will begin November 29 and 
will continue through 
December 1.

Trash will be picked up 
Wednesday instead of 
Thursday due to 
Thanksgiving. City offices 
will be closed Thursday and 
Friday.

Community Christmas
program will be on 
December 16, at the Catholic 
Church.

Nighten’ Gala will meet at 
Wynona Koetting’s home at 
6:30 p.m ., Tuesday,
November 27. Hostesses will 
be Evelyn Hubbard and 
Wynona Koetting.

i’s
Christmas Program will be 
December 19.

beginning November 25, 
practice will begin for the 
Com m unity C hristm as 
Program at 5:00 p.m. in the 
Catholic Church. Anyone 
interested is invited to 
attend.

TUESDAY GRAIN PRICES 
AT LOCAL ELEVATORS

Cash prices on grain 
posted at grain elevators 
serving the Groom area 
Tuesday afternoon: 

Wbeat-2.30 
MHo-3.75 
Cont-3.95
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Community Thanksgiving 
Service Held

The Groom Community 
Thanksgiving Service was 
held Sunday, November 18, 
in the First Btptist church. 
The comm unit / choir sang 
"Thanks Be To Thee” . Bro 
Eddie Hogan wstor of the 
First Bapti it Church 
welcomed the visitors from 
other churcies. After
c i n o i n n  art nth  I ' m

Davis pastor of the United 
Methodist Church of Groom 
gave the responsive reading. 
An offering was taken to go 
to the Community Fund, by 
Father Richard Neyer. Eddie 
Hogan gave the sermon and 
the benediction. Attendance 
was off slightly from last 
year.

Mary Smith of Dimmitt 
was a visitor in Groom over 
the weekend. She spent time 
visiting her daughter, Be 
Stephens and family. Mary 
also accompanied the family 
to a Hoescht Celanese 
Bingo in Pampa.

Burniece Johnson and 
Helen Witt visited in the 
home of Dr. Dan Witt in 
Hoisington, Kans., last 
week.

Groom
November

Anniversaries ft Birthdays
November 23-none 
November 24-Mrs. T. 

Dewain Weller, Rex T. 
Ruthardt, C.L. Weiberg, 
Rev. and Mrs. Jimmy Davis 

November 25-Christopher 
Lynn Ollinger, John Mark 
Baggerman and Mrs. Eldred 
Atchley

November 26-Mrs. Tony 
E. Treadwell, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clifton Britten, Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Payton and 
Malorie Homen 

November 27-Mrs. W.W. 
(Jack) Pool, Karen Elizabeth 
Britten. Mr. and Mrs. John 
L. (Jack) Stephens and 
Rusty Branch 

November 28-Mrs. Ted L. 
Friemel. Jam es A. 
Weinheimer, Mr. and Mrs. 
Alfred A. Homer and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bobby C. Howard, 
Joseph Gutierrez 

November 29-Mrs. W.A. 
Dickerson, Page Blackwell, 
Mrs. Bobby C. Howard, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jackie H. Barnett.

Texas trails
LONE SUB SWE HBTORY by DAN MOWN

M/V**

WITCHING FOR O I L . . .
The oil business was in its infancy in 1866. That year 
B.T. Kavanaugh, a medical doctor and preacher, was 
looking for oil, with a divining rod, in southeastern 
Texas. Kavanaugh took a short-term lease on a piece 
of land near present-day Beaumont. He never hit oil, 
bu* on Ian. 10, 1901, the Spindletop gusher blew-in on 
that same piece of land.

Irene and Ronald Kotara 
attended funeral services for 
Claude Higley in Dumas, on 
Friday of last week.

Glenn Smith visited last 
weekend with daughter, 
Donna Marie Wagner and 
family in Stratford.

Ivey Clark visited family ; 
George and Dorothy Clark 
and Nadine and Jerry 
Thornton last week.

Members of the First 
Baptist Church are asked if 
you would like to purchase a 
Memorial poinsetta plant for 
use at the church during the 
Christmas season, please 
contact Connie Fields or 
Mary Sue Lyles by Sunday, 
November 25. The plants 
will be used at the church 
until Sunday, December 23, 
at which time you may pick 
up your plant. The cost of 
the plants will be about 
$ 10.00.

First Baptist Church 
Office will be closed Thurs­
day and Friday, November 
23-24 for the Thanksgiving 
hoidays.

W ieberg, 

W elding 

Nathan Wieberg 

Shop-248-7270 

Hom e-248-7301

Mr. and Mrs. Joe D*vw 
and LaVesta Barnett 
attended funeral services for 
Roy Sandifer, 78, in 
Sherman, Texas, Thursday, 
November 15. He was Joe s 
Uncle and had visited in 
Groom several times.

Visiting in the home of 
Darrell. Charlotte, C.J. and 
Dara Whatley were; Furr 
and Faye Standridge of 
Claude. Laurence, Beverly, 
Cheryl and Tim Rose of 
Amarillo. The group enjoyed 
a Mexican dinner and 
attended the Guthrie/Miami 
game.

New Arrival
Jon Wesley Shields is the 

name given to the new son of 
Sgt. Danny and Neva 
Shields. Wesley was born on 
October 31, at 3:53 p.m. at 
Metroplex Hospital in 
Killeen, Tx. He weighted 7 
lbs. 1.4 oz. and was 2 in. 
long. He is welcomed by his 
3 1/2 year old sister Kaci 
Nichole Shields.

Proud grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Royce Brown 
of Groom and Mr. and Mrs. 
Danny Shields of Goodnight, 
Tx. Great grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. J.L. Shields of 
Goodnight, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Thompson of 
Welston, Okla.

Loula Wall is a patient in
Coronado Hospital in Pampa
at press time.

Nancy Blackwell is 
reported to be a patient at 
High Plains Baptist Hospital 
in Amarillo.

Lucille Case and Helen 
Witt visited Lenabel Newton 
at the Clairmont Home in 
Amarillo Monday.

It’s A Girl
Ben and Jennifer

W einheimer of Canyon, 
Texas announce the arrival 
of a baby girl, Brittany 
Alice, 6 lb. 1 1/2 oz. born at 
12:49 p .m ., Friday,
November 16,1990 in North­
west Texas Hospital, 
Amarillo. Grandparents are 
Bill and Linda Forman of 
Pampa and Pat and Maggie 
Weinheimer of Panhandle/ 
Groom.

Bill & Sam's New & Used.
Several large & small items for sale 

Yard Sale Weekend 
We Buy-Sell- Trade

RGM AG & , INC

Serving The Farmer *s 

Needs First!

Herbicides and 

Custom Application

Full Line O f Chemicals

AG t GRAIN. INC.
248-7551 248-7575
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Groom ISD

N.rtmbrr 26-30 
M aaday B r e a k f a s t  

cereal, bhieberry muffin;. 
juice and milk

Loach-steak f in g e rs , 
mashed potatoes, gravy, 
green beans, hot rolls an l 
jefo

Tuesday - breakfast - pa i 
cakes, peanut butter , syrup. 
juke and milk

L unch-pepperoni and 
cheese pizza, salad, corn 
cracker and pears 

Wednesday - Breakfast- 
scrambled eggs, hasli 
browns, toast, juice and mil) 

Lunch-shaved ham 
macaroni and cheese 
broccoli cuts, cole slaw 
whole wheat rolls and appl< 
cobbler

Thursday-Breakfast-bis- 
cuhs. bacon, gravy, juicr 
and milk

Lanch-barbequed polish 
sausage, buttered potatoes 
spinach, hot rolls, chocolate 
no-bake cookies 

Friday-Breakfast-Donuts, 
cinnamon rolls, juice and 
milk

Lunch-cheese burgers, 
french fries, pickles, onions, 
l e t tu c e ,  to m a to e s ,  
hamburger buns and yummy 
oatmeal cookies.

Gra*— ISD Receives 
Accreditation Report

The accreditation team, 
which visits the school 
annually has recently 
reported on areas where the 
school needs improvement. 
They are:

Groom 1SD must submit a 
campus improvement plan 
that has been completely 
developed.

The district must submitt 
a plan to complete the 
development and adaptation 
of all curriculum guides.

The district must submit a 
list of course offerings.

A plan to bring a bilingual 
program into full compliance 
with the TAC Chapter 77.

Evidence must be sub­
mitted that the science lab 
and ag shop are meeting 
safety standards.

The district must 
document that the facilities 
are free from health 
hazards.

A plan must be fromulat- 
ed to provide facilities to. 
accommodate the needs of 
handicapped.

Groom ISD will bring all 
items into compliance by 
November 26, 1990.

Pav's Service
C o n e  S ee  Us

For Your Automotive Needs!

Oil-Bo fteries 
Complete L ne Of Tires 

& Sc rvice
W holesale  D e live ries  

R e ta il-R eg u  ar-U n leaded
M o n - S a t . , 7:00  «».m. to 6:00  p.m.

“SERVICE 
YOU CAN TRUST” 

Complete Prescription Service

Convenient Mailing Service 
l Competitive Prices 

and Drive-lrp Window
Merlin Rose Phi rmacist, Owner 

EMERGENCY NUMBER 669-3559
I 24-Hour Emergency Service
1 928 N . H o b a r t ,< 6 9 -1 2 0 2  Pampo

Basketball Season Begins 

With Victory

Webb.
Junior Varsity Boys are; 

Mike Addis, Bronte Britten, 
Matt Fields, Wesley Hall, 
Corkey Hickey, Ronald 
Jenkins and Rhett
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Patterson.

Groom Varsity and Junior 
Varsity Tigerettes are; 
Susan Babcock. Shannon 
Fields. Katonia Meaker, 
Sherrie Weinheimer. Jolee 
Burger. Kristy Case, Lesa 
Sweatt, Karen Babcock. 
Amy Brown, Melinda 
Burgin, Marie Conrad. 
Kenzi Burger, Melody 
Burton, Rebecca Conrad, 
Kim Fields, Jaime 
Hammonds, Aimee Lyles. 
Andrea Payton and Angela 
Reed.

A. J. Newsomi 
1 Water Well 

Service
Submersible Pumpi<

Aero mo tor Windmills

Phone 248-7411
-

Groom Basketball Season 
began last week when Tigers 
and Tigerettes faced off with 
Higgins Coyotes and Lady 
Coyotes. Groom was victor­
ious both Tuesday night 
here and Friday night in 
Higgins.

Tuesday night action saw 
Tigerettes win 54 to 33. Boys 
score was Groom 59, 
Higgins, 51. Friday’s game, 
this time in Higgins, Girls 46 
to 36; Boys 67/44.

Coach Branch stated. 
"The Girl’s are not playing 
anywhere near their 
potential, but that will come. 
The Miami Tournament is 
coming up and the Ettes will 
face a lot of good teams. 
We’ll have to be more crisp 
if we expect to compete."

When asked about the 
Junior High he said, 
‘‘Seventh and Eighth 
Grades will play separately 
when the opposing team has 
a Seventh Grade Team. 
They (the J.H. girls) show

Texas Department Of Public 
Safety Encourages 

Safe Driving
The Thanksgiving Holiday 

has always been a day when 
we give thanks for the 
lifestyles were enjoy here in 
the United States-som e 
things a lot of us take for 
granted, such as our free­
dom. good jobs, vacation, 
and our automobile. Every­
one agrees the automobile 
and all it has brought to this 
nation is marvelous, but it 
could be an instrument of 
suffering and even death.

Major Vernon Cawthon, 
Regional Commander of the 
Texas Department of Public 
Safety in Lubbock, Texas, 
stated, “That this Thanks­
giving Holiday weekend, 
thousands more drivers will 
be on the streets and high­
ways. Some drivers will only 
be going across town-others 
will be crossing several 
states.”

Major Cawthon also said, 
"The Department of Public 
Safety wants you to have a 
safe and pleasant holiday, so 
if you are planning a trip out 
of town, check your car. the 
road conditions, the weather 
conditions, and your driving 
habits. Remember, that the 
early darkness and heavy 
traffic call for more caution 
and less speed.”

lots of potential. It just 
needs developing,”  said 
Branch.

Coach Lamb has had very 
little time to practice with 
football season ending on 
Friday and basketball 
starting on Monday. When 
asked what he thought of the 
Tigers first game he said, 
“The boys really were out 
their hustling but they are 
awfully rusty.”  He went on 
to say that they just needed 
time and a few more 
practices.

Junior High Boys have a 
large time year. There will 
be about 20 players, a a lot 
of talent to fit into each 
game.

Tigers and Tigerettes will 
play Silverton here on 
November 27, beginning at 
5:00 with the Junior Varsity 
Boys.

Junior High will play 
Shamrock there beginning at 
4:00 with Seventh Grade 
Girls.

The Groom Basketball 
Roster includes; Brian 
Baker, Bruce Britten, Mike 
Conrad, Jeff Fields, Daryl 
Homer, Nick Kuehler, 
Robert Miller and Kirk

C & H S upply  Inc. 
(M cLean)

301 E .  Foster
(8061 779 2209

Custom Fertilizer Blends 
Farm Bureau Tires And Batteries 

Evergreen Feeds

F r e e . . .
Mounting with each light truck or 
passenger car tire purchased thru 

November 29, 1990
W ith you and  your fam ily  S afe ty  

O ur # 1 P riority

We Wish Each O f  You  
A H A P P Y  T H A N K S G I V I N G

W E  D O  F I X  F L A T S



I <•

Page 4 1HE GROOM NEWS 
Thursday, Novimber 22, 1990

I.S.Ih Completes Performance Review

Groom Independent 
School Distri' 1 has just 
completed it's 1989-90 per­
formance revirw. This re­
port is an ann ial evaluation 
as to how well the school is 
meeting it's goals. The 
review gives the board a 
chance to pin mint areas of 
strength or wc akness so that 
future adjustrients in curri­
culum or polic es, etc. can be 
made. The following are 
highlights from the report. It 
can be read in it's entirety 
by contacting Superin­
tendent Sweat.

Goal l-Sti dent Perfor­
mance. All students will be 
expected to rteet or exceed 
educational performance 
standard: Gioom students 
consistantly scored higher 
on the TEAMS test and the 
MAT 6 test. Students have 
shown . stron > performance 
in the UIL Lit nary competit­
ion. Since l ‘>72 Groom has 
been repres ented at the 
State competition every 
year. In add tion to several 
state cham tionship, two 
students wore presented 
$1000.00 s< holarships by 
UIL. The sc tool paper has 
received awards twice by 
the Panhandle High School 
Press Associ ition.

The no pa is/ no play rule 
has made a positive impact 
on academk performances. 
Only two sti dents in Junior 
High and tvo students in 
High Sc hoi 4 became in­

eligible. Only one student in 
elementary failed. This 
equates to a five percent rate 
of failure in elementary. 
Failures in individual classes 
boiled high school down to 
less than two percent. Only 
one student failed more than 
one subject.

Groom instituted a sum­
mer reading a math pro­
grams for elementary 
s tu d e n ts  K in d erg arten  
through fourth for students 
who were below grade level 
capibilities in these areas.

A Gifted and Talented 
program is in operation for 
g r a d e s  K in d e rg a r te n  
through eighth grade within 
regular classroom. 1989-90 
was a developmental year 
for the high school program.

Eleven of 13 graduating 
seniors enrolled in a four or 
two year college.

Goal II-Curriculum-a well 
balanced curriculum will be 
taught so that all students 
may realize their learning 
potential and prepare tor 
productive lives: Teachers 
are documenting mastery of 
essential elements. Class­
room computers have been 
approved for grade three 
through five in 1991. The 
elementary computer lab 
has been expanded to in­
clude writing and math labs 
for grades four through six. 
A full time library aide is 
employed so that the library 
is open at all periods of the

day. Upper level classes are 
allowed to participate in 
field trips to research 
assignments in Amarillo 
where our library is less than 
adequate.

Goal III -Teachers and 
teach in g -q u a lified  and 
effective teachers will be 
attracted and retained: The' 
teaching staff has been 
reduced from 22 to 19 in the 
last two years. 45 percent 
hold m asters degrees, 
others are pursuing an 
advanced degree. Due to 
d ec reasin g  en ro llm en t, 
Groom has lost some state 
funds for career ladder 
participates. Although the 
school board passed a man­
date to only spend state 
allocations for career ladder, 
the Campus Improvement 
Committee has recommend­
ed that additional support 
money be made available. 
Of the teachers in Groom 
one graduated Summa Cum 
Luade. one Magna Cum 
Laude, one CumLaude and 
one with honors. Also the 
journalism teacher received 
the Edith Fox King Award 
for continuing excellence in 
teaching.

Goal mi: Organization 
and management: The or­
ganization and management 
of all levels of the 
educational system will be 
productive, efficient and 
accountable: The admin­
istrative staff has been 
reduced from 2 1/2 to 2. 
Expenses are provided for 
teachers and adminstrators 
to attend workshops, 
c o n v e n tio n s  an d

professional visits.
Goal rV-finance-the

financing of public education 
will be equitable to all 
students in the state. Groom 
lost 14,450.00 from the 1985- 
86 school year. The current 
tax rate of SI .25 should meet 
the needs of the school 
system for the next few 
years. The cost per student 
in 1989-90 school year is 
expected to be $5,302.00 
down slightly from 1988-89 
at $5,338.00. Asbestas 
abatement projects were 
completed with a cost of 
approximately $90,000.00

Goal VI: Parent and Com­
munity Involvement-Parents 
and other members of the 
Community will be partners 
in the improvement of 
schools.

The Drug Free Program 
has worked closely with the 
city and county. School 
Board organized the initial 
meeting. The community 
then took it over. A facilities 
sharing program has been 
worked out with the local 
4-H programs and the ag 
science department. Home 
Economics department host 
cooking demonstrations and 
other how to seminars.

Goal VII: The instruction 
program will be continually 
improved by the develop-, 
ment and use of more 
effective methods.

One identified in the 
Teams test was the over-all 
writing process. An 
improvement plan has been 
initiated throughout the 
curriculum. Computers and 
software has been updater I

to address this concern. 
Student services have been 
automated through the 
principals office.

Goal VIII- Communicat­
ions - Communications 
among all public education 
interests will be consistent, 
timely and effective.

Superintendant and
several teachers are 
members of the Local Lions 
Club.

Superintendant serves as 
secretary of Groom
Economic Development 
C o r p o r a t io n .  S e v e ra l 
Teachers are in Women’s 
Service Clubs.

We don’t  think 
there is a better 

place to haul your 
grain. JftL

“  We appreciate the opportunity 
to serve you. ”

ATTEBURY  
GRAIN, INC.
PHONE 248-7591 

Groom, Texas

W e’ve come To See The Best!!!!

I Hack well Supply 

O nce Upon A Time 
RG/M Ag & Grain, Inc. 

Wieberg Welding

Keith Barkley Auto Repair 
Tina's Hair Care-A-Sel 

Stop-N-Shop

Wheeler Evans Elevators Co. 
Bivens' Automotive

Brumley Insurance 
Attebury Grain, Inc. 

State National Bank 

The Groom News

GOOD LUCK
Groom Tigers 

And Tigerettes
BEAT

SILVERTON
HOOP MANIA Be a Groom Basketball Fan!!!

■
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Wedding Plans 
For Local Girl 
Announced

Announcing the engage­
ment and approaching 
marriage of Rebeca Ann to 
Kirk Raymond Weatherford. 
Parents of the bride are 
Amos and Loretta Britten of 
Groom. Parents of the bride­
groom are Dale and Mary 
Weatherford of Hartley. The 
wedding will be January 19,

1991. in Taos, New Mexico. 
Rebecca is currently 
employed with Texas Tech 
Medical Services of Amarillo 
as a Patient Account Repre­
sentative. Kirk is currently 
employed . with Holmes 
Construction Company of 
Amarillo as an Estimator.
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Stavenhagen Furniture
Downtown Clarendon

SALE
Fatigue Causes Accident

"A Sacrificial Wall To Wall 
Clearance Of All Furniture, Appliances 

& Carpet!! Come Early For Best Selections 
First Come -  First Serve!”

Until 
All

M e rch a n d ise
S o g

Bargins 
Bar gins Bargins

Open 
S u n d a y  

1 -  6  PM

A $ 2 0 0 ,0 0 0 .0 0  Inventory Offered 
Direct To Th e  Public A t Up To 6 0 %  Off

$299

4 Of**r Slo«*' r Chtlt I P* Early American 8>a$» Plated Headboard* S Pc Bedroom Croup Man Sue Recltner S Pc Riichen Set

$ 3 9 $ 1 1 4 0 $57 $784 $483 $361
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• /  llUk iOAlMNti CHi.WS

LIVING ROOM BEDROC M SUITS DINING ROOM
L A -Z -B o y  Sactional V - B  W i w n 5 - P t  All W ood D w ftfl

$ 1 8 5 9 0 0
I F tankkM  S o fa  A C h air
| I ■ »

*99 9.00

* 7 9 3 .0 0  *1119.00
R ock C ity  9afc

lota l WM><- $223 ) .  00
C h ao
■» .tr- OMNI Pulaski / nuque

R a p ro d u  lion Gro< 
ja* i

J H  Brwsi ft Uhi D»**M 
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$ 79 9 .0 0
P u U ak l 7 -P c  O ak Dining 

Room  Surte

$1199 00
f  |  S o fa  A C h ap

mni-" •«
"*$1099.00

$ 1 4 3 2 0 0

Up To 
607. 
Off

10 A M
To

7 P.M.
tee C«r.<

T H E Y  H A V E  .
ARRIVED!

The G reatest South land Values O f The Year!!!

* 3 8 9 £  OO

NAME BRANDS OFFEHED
* c sU Jw .it C h a u

•FJ*s«t«*t aChrowtctafl
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•R ock  C ilf  _
• P U a tk l * R le h a rd s o n  B ro ». FnMli. *0 E Appliance
• »•>»«• .PhUUlWphla Cn al

ITIWS SOLD FUST COMt FIRST FRVID

* 5 5 .0 0  *-*
ODDS A ENOS 

Flow Lamp
Oat MUt *

$79 00
F r a n k k n . C o ntem porary 

tHtM.
■ ««•>•<• emtm
On* ON»

*379 00

• .IU.0WT0r»ATT«li»
• WOMHUDCOM'OIT
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Doors Open At 10 AM Sharp
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An early morning one- 
vehicle accident Wednesday 
outside of Groom left two 
men in the hospital-one in 
critical condition, said a 
spokesman for the Depart­
ment of Public Safety.

Trooper John Waits said 
the accident involved three 
men who were traveling 
westbound on Interstate 40 
about two miles west of 
Groom.

The pickup the men were 
traveling in ran off the road

and rolled over at about 7:30 
a.m. Wednesday, sending 
all three men to the hospital- 
one in stable condition and 
one in critical condition.

Waits would not release 
the names of the individuals 
or which hospital they were 
taken to.

Although the cause of the 
accident is yet to be deter­
mined , the office said he 
thinks fatigue may be a 
probable cause.

DPS Report
A nationwide IH-40 task 

force was conducted on 
November 8, 1990. This 
operation was conducted 
from 7:00 a.m. on 11-8-90 to 
7:00 a.m on 11-9-90. All the 
states that IH-40 passes 
through were involved. 
T h ese  w ere  the California 
Highway P a tr o l , Arizona 
State Police. New Mexico 
State Police. Oklahoma 
Highway Patrol, Arkansas 
State Police, Tennessee 
State Police and the North 
Carolina Highway Patrol. 
This operation had a State 
Trooper every 10 miles on 
IH-40 for a 24 hour period. 
All violations from traffic to 
criminal were targeted in

WTSU Chapter 
Of Alpha Chi

Inducts New Members
Eighty-five members of 

West Texas State 
University’s junior and 
senior classes were inducted 
into the Texas Zeta Chapter 
of Alpha Chi, a national 
honor scholarship society, 
during a special ceremony 
on Thursday, November 8.

Membership in Alpha Chi 
is by invitation only and is 
limited to students who have 
a grade point average of 3.50 
or higher (on a 4.0 scale) and 
rank in the top 10 percent of 
their respective class.

Mary Main Howard, a 
senior criminal justice ad­
ministration major of Groom 
and Jowannah A. Ruthardt 
Powers, a senior general 
business major of Groom 
were inducted.

There are 271 chapters of 
Alpha Chi across the 
nation. The Texas Zeta 
Chapter at West Texas State 
University is the sixth oldest 
and traces its origins to the 
year 1923.

WTSU chapter sponsors 
are Dr. Peter L. Petersen, 
professor of history; Dr. 
Mary Ann Petry. associate 
professor of art; and R. 
Duane Rosa, assistant pro­
fessor of economics.

this operation.
The Texas Highway Patrol 

stopped around 860 vehicles 
on 1-40 in the Texas Pan­
handle. There were around 
750 tickets written and about 
110 warnings. Several 
fugitive arrests were made 
along w ith a large drug 
seizure mad just west of 
Groom on 1-40.

Trooper John Waight of 
Borger stopped a car on a 
traffic violation around 4:00 
p.m. at the 107 MP on 1-40. 
A search of the vehicle was 
conducted and five and one 
half pounds of Cocaine was 
discovered in the vehicle. 
The drive James Townsend 
from Memphis TN and the 
passenger a Earnest Parker 
were both arrested for 
Aggravated Possession of 
Cocaine and placed in jail at 
Panhandle. The approx­
imate value of the cocaine 
was set at $55,000.00. Both 
subjects wer held on 
SI .000.000.00 bonds, but 
were later reduced to 
$100,000.00 on both.

On 11-14-90 Betsy Baugh­
man and Charlene Mansel of 
Groom were involved in a 
accident at the intersection 
of Second and Martin Street. 
No injuries were received 
and tickets were issued to 
both parties involved. In­
vestigated by Deputy Tim 
Taylor and Trooper Gary 
Davis.

On 11-08-90-Virgil Boyd 
McCuller of Groom was 
stopped on a traffic violat­
ion. A wanted check 
revealed that he had out­
standing DPS warrants out 
of Sherman Texas. McCuller 
was released on payment of 
$140.00 in fines.

On 11-15-90 Deputy Tim 
Taylor was called to a traffic 
accident on IH-40 1.8 miles 
west of Grom. A TTST 
driven by AzFir Mahld 
Motouski of Phoenix AZ., 
was westbound on IH-40. 
The duel wheels on the rear 
trailer came off and tore 
down some fence owned by 
Chris Britten of Groom. No 
citations were issued.
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Baptist Women 
Learn Of 

The i%.«iddle East
All or n< arly all you ever 

wanted to know about the 
middle Eat t was divulged to 
a group cf women at the 
Groom Ba itist Church last 
week. Nell Thomas of 
Pampa, the Mission Study 
Director for Palo Duro 
A s s o c ia tio n  U .M .U . 
presented information about 
the cultu e, explanation of 
some of their religious 
practices and examples of 
some of the fruits, flowers 
and spier s which are grown 
there. Sfe had prepared an 
interest -enter backed by a 
silhouett; of a city, with 
miniatur: figures of a camel, 
and donkey, with the spices 
etc. Maps, scarues, table 
clothes, and other things 
depictin > aspects of their

culture A soldier read 
letters ; he was sending to 
her fam ly in the states from 
somehwere in Saudie 
Arabia. Placemats had in­
formation of the area, and 
multiple choice questions. 
Nell hal prepared booklets 
for e> eryone with the 
Korean's ninety-nine most 
beautifil names of God, 
some of their proverbs, 
customs, food recipes and 
religkH is beliefs. The women 
had \  repared a meal of 
Middle East recipes, 
indud ng curried chicken, 
manse f (veg. stew), both 
serve* with rice, bouhgasha 
( a dough stuffed with 
walnuts, raisins, then fried, 
dipped in warm honey and 
sprinkled with chopped 
walm ts. date bars and fresh

&• a U .

v :  -  * -  ,
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Carson County A bstract Co. 
Realtors, Abstractors of T itles

222 Main St. 537-3561 Panhandle, Texaa

The Latest Technology 
in Custom Application

tm u m r

AIR-ASIATIC
IMPREGNA TOR

Daniel Lambert Kidnapped
Daniel Lambert, home on 

leave from the Air Force, 
was kidnapped Thursday 
night by Girl Scout Troop 21 
of Groom. He was taken to 
the Dairy Queen were the 
girls revealed that he had 
been officially adopted as

Troop 21's Big Brother.
Troop members presented 

Daniel with official adoption 
papers, a box of candy and 
letters they had intended to 
send him at Halloween, but 
decided to wait until he 
came home. He recently was 
stationed in England. New

orders will post him in San 
Antonio.

Girl Scouts are Karen and 
Angiel Conrad, Amber 
Conrad, April Burton, Tami 
Ashford, Jenny Lewis and 
Mary Hutsell.

vegetable sticks and date 
and banana dessert. They 
were the first to put together 
fresh vegetable for salad. 
When they serve you coffee 
in their home it is time for 
you to leave. Twelve ladies 
and Amanda Hogan 
attended. They were Marion 
Hogan, Thelma Pool, Nell 
Thomas, Billie Bivens, 
Mildred Burgin, Peggy 
Cave, Stella Patterson, 
Bertha Knight, Cleo 
M usser, Carole Fields, 
Vonnie Barker and Fannie 
Asberry.

We Repair All 
Kinds ot

RADIATORS
•Plastic •Aluminum 
•Copper (B rass

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *

665-0190 or 1-000-762-6381
JOHN a CAROLYN̂TOK*ES<IWNER 525 W. Brown Hwv 60-Psmp,. Tm.

Open Saturday Mornings
66 5-01 9 0JPNO ANSWER 6C5-7M6

PAMPA

PERFECT PLACEMENT OF 
FERTILIZER OR SEEDS 

FOR GOVERNMENT SET-ASIDE ACRES

The Air* Matte impregnates Is the newest, most efficient ap­
plicator on the market, covers big acres fast, maintaining a 
great spread pattern and perfect placement.

Come in and visit us about the benefits of 
fall application o f your fertilizer.

Contact Leslie Red wine or Golden

Spread COOP. Panhandle, Tx. 537-3518

**************

‘Business Card ‘Register

I Happy Thanksgiving 

BoB Clements, Inc.
Fine Tailoring, Dry Cleaning, Custom Windows 

j 1437 N. Hobart 665-5121
I I  A member df the Internationa] Fabric are Institute.
1 l the association of professional dry cleaners and launderers

D e a r  S a n ta ,

I f  y o u  c a n ’t f in d  m y  

p r e s e n t  a t  h o m e . . .  T r y  

P A M P A

\yAYNES \̂ ESTERN V̂ EAR Inc.

25 % Off AH Ladies Dresses 

Friday & Saturday Only

1504 N. Hobart 665-2925 Pampa, Texas

I Pets Unique
Pets Supplies Grooming 

910 W. Kentucky Pampa &

| 665-5102 * 4
1 Full line of pet supplies \

THE CHRISTMAS SHOP
209 N. Cuyler

C h ris tm as  T re e s -O rn a m e n ts  

iw l^ r  G o u rm et Food Item s 

And S tocking S tu ffe rs  

O P E N -9:00 a m . to 5:30 p . m.

One Hour Martinizing
Bring your cleaning when you shop

in Pam pa ..........

Pick it up the same day!!!!

Two locations to serve you- 
1807 N. Hobart-1824 W. Francis
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Lovett L lbrar'
Box B,
McLeajrr'Tx. 7905^

Tigers Win Bi-District Playoffs

McLean Co* :hes Jerry Miller Jeff Streun A Ronnie Miller

School Board Unanimously Approves 
Sam Haynes As Director Of Gray

County Appraisal District
The McLean Independent 

School District School Board 
met November 13, 1990 at 
6:00 p.m. Members present 
were Bill Thomas. Jake 
Hess, Gwen Henley, Steve 
Brass. Thacker Haynes and 
Joe Magee. Others present 
were Rei Peeoles. Jerry Don 
Cook. John Griffin, Shirley 
Johnson and approximately 
thirty visitors.

President Hess welcomed 
visitors who had a variety of 
questions and concerns, 
some being about a water 
connection on the play 
ground where a child was 
recently injured and 
inquiries about the drug and 
alcohol abuse program.

The Annual Performance 
Report was presented and 
approved. This is a yearly 
review of how the goals of 
the Texas State Board of 
Education are implemented 
and carried out in the 
district's school system.

The Board unanaously

voted to cast 289 votes for 
Samual A. Haynes as a 
director of the Gray County 
Appraisal District.

A decision was made to 
advertise for bids to sell a 
1982 Ford Bus.

The textbook committee 
was appointed for the year 
1990-91. They will be John 
Griffin. Jerry Don Cook, and 
Rex Peeples.

During Basketball season 
the McLean School Board 
will meet on Thursday even­
ing at 5:30 p.m.

The tax assessor's report, 
check report, the financial 
statement and the cafeteria 
reports were given and 
approved by all.

Several queries were 
posed by the group as the 
school’s role in the incident 
concerning two football 
players and a cheerleader 
who were involved in a fight 
Saturday night. The inquiry 
was made whether there 
were rules of conduct for

participants in extracur­
ricular activities such as 
cheerleading and football, 
and whether the students 
were accountable for the 
conduct. Mr. Peeples 
replied that students in 
extracurricular activities 
were considered as repre­
sentatives of the school. He 
stated that under the law 
you cannot deprive a student 
of public education. Mr. 
Peeples explained that he 
had to leave early Monday 
morning and that he had 
instructed the High School 
Principal. Mr. Cook, to get 
with the sponsors of the 
activites in which the 
students were involved and 
to get the facts and their 
recommendations. He stated 
that an administrative 
decision had been made to 
suspend these students from 
participation in extra­
curricular activities for the 
remainder of the year.

The McLean Tigers 
recovered from an 18-0 
deficit, scoring 38 un­
answered points en route to 
an 42-34 Bi-District victory 
over the explosive Valley 
Patriots.

Daniel Harris scored for 
touchdowns for McLean on 
runs of 4,5,5 and 16 yards. 
Harris also scored on a 60 
yard run.

McLean’s kicking game 
was very important in the 
contest as Tufly Sanders 
kicked a 30 yard field goal 
and 4 extra points.

Clay Edwards, speed 
Patriot running back, was a 
constant threat to the Tigers 
and scored four times in the 
exciting contest, which 
many said was among the 
greatest every played here.

The Tiger offense was 
propelled by great blocking 
for the line as well as all 
members of the buckfield, 
and every member of the 
defense rose to the occasion 
at critical times.

The Tigers will host the 
Silverton Owls Friday night 
at Lefors, 7:30 p.m. in the 
reg ional cham pionship  
game.

Suspension To Be Appealed
McLean School Superin­

tendent Rex Peeples said 
Monday morning the 
appeals process to whether 
or not to allow two McLean 
football players back on the 
team was being put forth. 
Peeples said, that the initial 
decision of suspension by 
the principal and adminis­
tration was being upheld 
and that the next step of the 
process would be for the 
school board to hear the 
appeal. The school board 
was scheduled for 
e m e rg e n c y , e x e c u tiv e  
session, Tuesday at 3:00 
p.m . with the school’s 
attorney conducting the 
meeting.

Mr. Peeples said, "The 
young peoples’ right to a

Services Held

Wednesday For 

Ruby Pearl Lilly

Ruby Pearl Lilly, 79, died 
Monday, November 19, 
1990.

Services were at 1:00 p.m. 
Wednesday in the First 
Baptist Church with the Rev. 
Jeff M essner, pastor, 
officiating. Burial was in 
Alanreed Cemetery by Lamb 
Funeral Home.

Mrs. Lilly, born in Bronte, 
moved to Washington, 
Okla., in 1972 from 
Alanreed. She married 
Granville Lilly in 1948 at 
Spearman. She was a 
member of the First Baptist 
Church. She was preceded 
in death by a son.

Survivors include her hus­
band; two daughters, Jean 
Cator of Stinnett and Mary 
Jo Smith of Corpus Christi; 
two sons, Herman Sanders 
of San Antonio and Don 
Sanders of McLean; 19 
grandchildren; and 16 great­
grandchildren.

hearing would be heard and 
that they would be given due 
process.” He further stated 
his feelings were that it was 
a student’s priviledge to 
participate in a school's 
extracurricular activities.

A decision for the 
suspended cheerleader was 
automotically upheld due to 
previously written policies 
governing McLean Cheer­
leaders.

Last week three McLean 
High School students were 
arrested on assault charges 
following a November 11, 
incident in the McLean City 
Park.

Dennis M. Hill, 18 and 
Dwayne Rodney Hill, 19, 
were suspended from all 
extracurricular activities in­
cluding football for the re­
mainder of the school year. 
The brothers were both 
starters on McLean’s 10-0 
football team, now in the 
state playoffs.

A seventeen year old, 
high school cheerleader in 
McLean was also arrested 
last week on the assault of 24 
year old Lanisa Lynn Sutton.

Dennis and Dwayne Hill 
were arrested and arraigned 
on assaulting three men who 
attempted to break up a 
fight between the Hill’s and 
Worsham on Sutton. 
Dwayne was also arrested on 
a second count of assault 
with bodily injury after 
Sutton filed charges against 
him.

Send Off 
For

Football Team
A send off of the McLean 

Tiger Football team is slated 
for Friday, November 23, at 
5:15 p.m. at the McLean 
Football Field. The public is 
invited to come boost the 
Tigers on to victory. Fans 
are reminded to bring their 
black and gold shackers to 
Lefors and there will be 
more at the game if you wish 
to purchase one.

Jessi Cooper, Mark Mize 
and Robert Cooper were 
treated and released from 
Coronado Hospital.

S u tton  w a s  a d m it te d  to  
th e  h o s p ita l  a n d  r e le a s e d
after suffering fractures to 
her cheekbones and
numerous bruises and lacer­
ations to her face.

--------------- ^ -------- 1

REMINDER' |
McLEAN COMMUNITY I 

CALENDAR

Practice Every Monday
night at Lodge, studying the 
L.I.F.E. Program (Lodge in­
formation for excellance).

McLean First Baptist
Church will have a fellow­
ship dinner on Thanksgiving 
Day, November 21, at 7:00 
p.m.

The lions C)ab will be 
selling pecans again this 
year. The new crop should 
be in about the middle of 
November.

City Offices will be closed 
for Thanksgiving November 
22 and 23.

McLean Tigers Victory 
Caravan to Lefors, Friday 
night leaving Debbie 
Acuna’s place at 6:30 p.m. 
Line up on Pampa Hwy. 
Let’s all line up and support 
the Tigers.

McLean Numbers 
To Remember

Ambulance 1-800-692-1331
Fire 779-2226
Law 779-2516

School
Grade School 779-2671
High School 779-2571
Business Office 779-2301
Library 779-2851
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Alanreed News
Ruth McLean served the 

first Thanksgiving Day 
dinner in Alant eed this year, 
since all her family have 
plans to go to Oklahoma on 
Turkey day to Ruth’s 
Mothers.

Mr. and Mr;. R.L. Leeder 
made a quick t rip to Wheeler 
on Sunday, d ie  to the fact 
his mother wi s hospitalized 
and is serious y ill.

Visiting Lena Carter on 
Sunday was vfr. and Mrs. 
Jim Bruce i nd David of 
Amarillo.

Anita Brue< was in Pampa 
on Friday.

Country Com er ©  
Texaco TI“ “
SUNDAY SPECIAL:

Ro ast Beef, Potatoes, Gravy,
M j xed V egatables, Salad

and Dessert. $3.99
Call In Orders Welcome 

Country Burgers Everyday
EXIT 142 McLean 779-2391

McLean Care Center. •  •

Bill Pitts returned this 
week from a two week visit 
to his parents in New York 
State.

Visiting the Robert Bruces 
on Sunday were Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Bruce and family 
of Pampa.

Oran Dorsey made a trip 
to ARizona last week to see 
about his mother and visited 
relative there.

McLean Care Center is 
happy to report Pearl 
Hudson and Pat Myers has 
returned home from the 
hospital , both are doing 
very well.

S e v e ra l r e s id e n ts  
attended Sunday school. Our 
helpers and leaders were 
Inez Trostle, Ona Trew, 
Maebelle Neash, Mary 
Frazier and Ella Mae 
Massey. In the afternoon 
members of the Methodist 
Church were here to hold 
services.

Residents playing bingo 
Monday were Ruby Ayers, 
Kittie Hessey, Adelle 
Walker, Ruby King, Dick 
and Mattie Wheeler, Leon 
Burch, Frank Thomason, 
Eula Morrow, Mary Helen 
Boston, Thelma Hopkins, 
Monnie Matthews, Pauline 
Miller, Lucy Skipper, Earl 
Tolleson, Clyde Trusty and 

] John Meyers. Our helpers 
’were Cliffie Heasley and 
Sylvia McClellan. Bananas

were furnished by the Lions
Club.

Tuesday Una Carter and 
Brenda Maclain were here to 
assist the following resi­
dents in dominos, Teresa 
Richardson, Imogene King, 
Adelle Walker, Mary Helen 
Boston and Thelma 
Hopkins.

Wednesday afternoon the 
residents enjoyed an ice 
cream and cake social given 
by the Methodist Friendship 
class. Inez Trostle was here 
to serve the refreshments.

Thursday eleven residents 
celebrated their birthdays. ( 
Bobby Richardson was here 
to sing and play the guitar, 
our clown "Girtie” played 
by Mary Dwyer added a lot 
of enjoyment to our party. 
Corsages and Boutonniers 
were furnished by Creed and 
Wanda Lamb. The 
decorated cake was 
furnished by Ruth Ayers and 
the Angel food cakes by 
Karen Brown and Mary

i------------------ THANK YOU------------------1
| I want to thank everyone for their support j 
| and courtesies during my recent campaign for j

M . Kent Sims l
>.,r.O.*oa Mi.Wmltr.TI 73096 I

131st District Judge.
jpol.odv.paid for by SMS C a g H ^ D d b ic  Honing,Ti

9 * ^  es~
“Tlw S  

6  Sound Owl ^
S

Auction Co.

McLrsn. T*. 79057 Box 42 (806) 779-J1J4

A special thank you to 
George Van Hury for 
furnishing all the residents 
with bananas

Dwyer. Ladies serving were 
Sylvia McClellan, Inez 
Trostle and Mary Dwyer.

City Of Groom 
Sales Tax Rebate Down

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock said Friday that 
sales taxes collected in July. 
August and September of 
this year showed a steady 
increase over last years 
collections. .

“These rebates are right 
in line with our projections 
and show healthy economic 
growth in Texas,” Bullock 
said.

The Comptroller s office 
today sent $140 million in 
sales tax rebate checks to 
cities and counties through-
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Oir employee* ere a W .  
" t e a *  member*. We work as 
Minfividoali but within then  
M toun concept, h  take* the ^  
■•entire team working 
Altogether to be the Number 11  
a. store in this area. We are If 

rpond of oar team and we’re 
flprood to be Number 1. “

Do yon want to be on the 
N Number 1 team? ”

1 
1

'1
Are you a winner?

gt Do you not just like working 1 
with people, bat lore it? ,  *1 I

(t We have [kwNWs available | .  
now for Lore’s team 
members. S4 JO to S4.7S per 

ir. Apply in person at:
MO A Conway. Tx.cr
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out Texas.
Payments to cities totaled 

$128 million for an 8 percent 
increase over last year’s 
total payments at this time.

Locally Claude in 
Armstrong County showed 
an increase of 4.66 percent 
increase over last year. They 
received a net payment this 
period of $3,816.69. In 
Carson County Groom 
received a net payment this 
period of $2,101.27, which is 
down 33.07 percent over a 
comparable payment made 
the prior year. Total pay­
ments to date are $23,473.03 
in 1989 payments to date 
totaled $24,981.08 which 
show a decrease once again 
of 6.04 pecent.

Panhande showed a de­
crease along with 
Skellytown. White Deer was 
the only Carson County city 
which showed an increase. 
White Deer received a net 
paym ent this period of 
$3,284,55 which was up 
17.70 percent. County total 
revealed an increase of 1.41 
percent. County wide net 
payment this period totaled 
$12,679.43.

Gray County showed a 
decrease of 0.49 percent. 
Lefors received a net pay­
ment this period of $536.17, 
M c L e a n -$ l,603 .14  and 
Pampa-$133,459.96. Lefors 
was down 12.07, McLean 
was down 5.99 percent and 
Pampa-.35 percent. Net pay­
m en ts  totaled $135,599.27 
for Gray County this period.

Good Luck
McLean Tigers 

Beat Silverton
at Lefors Nov.23 at 7:30 p.m.

We Are All Behind You! 
Simpson Insurance Agency

#  Jos per Roofing C & H  Supply, Inc
#

McLean Pharmacy
Johnnie & Colleen Cowboy Cafe 

Coiinne's Style Shop M ertel Boot Shop ^

Cl Paso Natural Gas Co,Ba ik Of Commerce

Lamb Flower Shop Puckett's Grocery

% Country Comer Texaco Alberta's Beauty Shop The McLean News I

£  Richardson Texaco Hambright Building Supplies B&BTurbine *

Jj; McLean Hardware Taylor Food M art Magee Ranch $

5  James Hef ley Auction Co



Wedding Slated For
L o c a l ( l i r l

VIDEO QUEST Z ;“
RENTALS “ • —

Cal 779-2311

Tapes 2 /S3.CO

1500 SPECIALS
Fue\. A Sal. • 1 h o  Days Ai One Duv Price 

Fhur. AU Fapes Rentali LOO Each 
Hank VSH Tapes 53.25

Open 12-7 Closed Wed & Sun.

Mr an<1 Mrs Frank 
W orsham of Allanreed 
announce the engagement 
and approaching marriage of 
their daughter Sallv to 
Chester Bohlar Jr. Chester 
is the son of Mr and Mrs. 
C hester Bohlar Sr. of 
McLean The couple plan to 
marry December I. at 2:00 
p m at the McKinney resi­
dence in Clarendon. The

HOPE FOR RINGING EARS

Pampa, Texas - Insom­
nia, depression, mental 
stress, nervousness, an­
xiety. These words more 
often describe what over 
35 million Americans ex­
perience, according to 
the American Tinnitus 
Association.
As a result of a sev­

en-year study by UNIMAX 
Hearing Instruments, 
Inc. there is now hope 
of relief for many suf­
fers of tinnitus, espe­
cially those with accom­
panying hearing losses.

If you or a loved one 
have been experiencing 
ringing, buzzing, fry­
ing, or other noises in 
the ears, you'll want to 
take advantage of a new 
tinnitus analysis serv­
ice available at the 
Professional Hearing Aid 
Services, 1534 N. Ho­
bart, Pampa. For a no- 
cost, no-obligation 
analysis to find out if 
you may be helped, call 
1-800-735-9137 or 669- 
0237 for an appointment.

Jjt J(C.-Tfc. ofc, Ofc. Ofc. Jjc. Ofc. J|C. Jfc. 0(c. Ofc. 0(C. Jjc.

IM C O U U W C R C U R Y
*
*
*
*

G R A Y c o u n t y  f o r d -u n c o l n -m e r c u r y
701 W. drown

Dear Neighbor:

Pampa, Texas 665-8404

You nay have noticed that something was different at the 
local Fool-Lincoln-Mercury D e a l ership the last time you were in 
P a n p a . lin'd like to make you aware of some of the changes that 
have take . place at Pamp.i Ford-Lincoln-Mercury since the last 
time you fistited the dealership. First of all, we'd like to 
tell you ibout the new ownership. We're Val Cerventes and Larry 
HOUston, »nd we,ve recently assumed ownership of the dealership. 
Both of u» return to the area from Wichita Falls, Texas, and 
have over 30 years of automotive experience between us. We real­
ize that ustomer service Is vital to both the success of our 
dealership and your satisfaction. Therefore, we have committed 
to provid* only the best inFord products and service at a price 
you can afford. Our door is always open and we encourage you 
to let us know how we can serve your automotive needs.

we ’ v 
Mercury b 
with the 
you know 
r e g i o n . 
you deser

Howe 
the emplo 
committme 
oner sati 
truly car 
to ensure

If y 
Please le 
you own a 
we want y 
warrantle 
sent as 1 
that our 
to see us 
665-8404 
a service

So t 
serviced, 
by the de 
look for*

; also changed our name to Gray County Ford-Lincoln- 
ecause not only have we sommitted to provide Pampa 
->est in Ford products and service, we wanted to let 
that we have made the same commitment to the entire 
Ve want to provide you with the quality service that 
ve.

ver, this a ttitude isn't just the new owners. All of 
/ees at Gray C o u n t y  F o r d -Lincoln-Mercury have made the 
nt to provide tane region with the best possible cust- 
sfact ion in both sales and service. Our employees 
e about your needs and will do everything possible 
that you are a statisfied customer.

sently own a vehicle that you purchased from us 
now if there is anything we can do for you. If 
product that you purchased from another dealership 
know that we will honor all Ford Motor Company 
will provide you services with the same commit- 
had bought the vehicle from us. we also realize 
town customers may have to make a special trip 

t's why, if you perfer, you may call ahead at 
us know that y o u ’re coming and we'll reserve 

for you.

ou pre 
t us k 
Ford 

ou to 
s and 
f you 
out of 
. Tha 
to let 
t ime

he next time you're In Pampa to have your Vehicle 
or even if it's just to shop or visit freinds, come 

alership to  meet the new owners and employees. We 
ard to getting to know you.

Sincerely,

Val Cervantes, President

Larry Houston, Vice President

I I yzr* -TT~:74

prospective bride graduated 
Irom McLean High School 
and a ttends Amarillo 
College. The prospective 
groom graduated  from 
McLean High School and is a 
student at West Texas State 
University and is employed 
at H Bar H Farms in 
Amarillo.

The couple will make their 
home in Amarillo.

MS Christmas Parti 
Sunday. December 2

On Sunday. December 2. 
1990 The Panhandle Chapter 
of the National Multiple 
Sclerosis Society will hold its 
annual Christmas Party at 
the W ashington Avenue 
Christian Church. 3800 
W ashington Avenue, in 
Amarillo. All those
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registered with the chapter 
and their families are invited 
to attend There will be 
entertainment and refresh­
ments will be served. There 
is no charge. To make a 
reservation , call Jim 
McKee. 359-6710 weekends 
only or Fredricka Gens. 372- 
4429, during the dav.

MCLEAN LODGE 
No. 889 
AF&AM

Stated Meeting 
2nd Thursday

Practice Every Monday 
7:30 p.m.

VISITORS WELCOME 
Olln J. Weldon, W.M. 

J. Boyd Smith, Secretary

Pro-Pak 
DogFood
C o P p
“ t l i c  Pro-Pak 26 I SO 
great 100 nutritionally comolete 
dog food for active dogs It has 26 
protein is fortified with vitamins and 
minerals, dogs like it and I've got 
it on sale

Per 50 lb. Bag We Sell Performance

C & H Supply, Inc.
779-2209 McLean

j(o Jjc. jM c. $ $ o f o . J | 0 #

Y o re  house a in ’t u n tid y , but if th e  po lice  
w uz ca lled  in, th e y ’d say th e re ’s sign  

of a s tru g g le !”

779-2461
McLean,

Texas
A Subsidiary of C ra yC o  Bant Shares, Inc

FDKIBANK OF 
COMMERCE
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McLean's
November Birthdays 
And Anniversaries

N o v e m b e r 22 -D ale  
Barker. Seth Bit wn and 
David Crockett

N o v e m b e r 2 3 - F re d a  
Holland. Evelyn Hint. Ann 
Gardner

N o v em b er 2 4 -J e s s e  
Coleman, Sophie Hutchison, 
Velam Kinard and Robert
Sanderson

N o v e m b e r 2 S - B i 11
Hambright and Terri Lee

D E A N ’S
2217 Perrvtoo Parkway

pharmacy
fjuO AftflL ofTf-oovn

Looking forward 
to serving our 

Groom customers. 
Ask about our 

mail service.
Welcome Welfare Recipients

Special Discounts 
to Senior Citizens on all 

Prescriptions.
Dean Copeland ^  iim T. Pepper
Home 665-2698 Business 669 6896 Home ^ ,9 .9 7 , 0

N o v em b er 26 -T o n ia  
Webster

N o v em b er 2 7 -Jo h n  
Bentley, Brodey Carter, Kay 
Magee, Jess Coleman 

N ovem ber 28-Thelm a 
Hopkins and Bill Rigsby 

N ovem ber 29-V ersie 
Collie, Hartley Davis, 
Jeannie Adams and Jim 
Aufill

Anniversaries 
November 23-Mr. and 

Mrs. Jay Longino
November 27-Mr. and 

Mrs. Walt Bailey and Mr. 
and Mrs. Allen Turpen

Your School
Rex Peeples—

Children improve their 
reading ability by reading, 
and reading, and reading 
some more. The U.S. 
Department of Education 
has found that children’s 
reading success depends 
upon how much time they 
spend reading each day.

That’s where your role as 
a parent is so important. 
More than half of all fifth 
graders say they spend only 
four minutes a day reading 
at home. Those same 
students, however, spend 
more than two hours watch­
ing TV.

Research show that 
children who spend as little 
as 30 minutes a day reading 
books, magazines, and 
newspapres are more likely

to become good readers.
They’re more likely to 

read faster, score higher, 
and do better in high school 
and college.

This week try keeping a 
chart of your and your 
children’s reading and TV 
time, afterwards, talk about 
what you’ve learned.

Are you watching more 
TV than you should? Are 
your children reading less 
than they should?

You might try a regular 
family reading time every 
day. And remember , 
chldren love to have you 
read to them. Let your 
children read to you, too. 
The important thing is to 
spend time reading.

Interesting cities I have ever 
visited. There we visited the 
Great Wall, a great feat of 
engineering and building. 
We visited Teanumen 
square, t ie  forbidden city 
and several other interesting 
places.

Next we went to visit Terra 
Cota Army. One figure of 
soldiers and horses had been 
their since 205 B.C. We 
went next to Shonghan. 
From there we took a cruise. 
We visited a school for 
gifted children and several 
scenic attractions and 
gardens. We next went to

Hongzhoo, where visited 
many beautiful attractions. 
We also toured a silk 
factory where they made silk 
from the cacoon to the 
finished piece.

A highlight of our trip was 
visiting the emperors 
summer palace. We went to 
Hong Kong and took a cruise 
there and saw the boat 
people. We flew from Hong 
Kong to San Francisco then 

to Dallas. We were gone 
about sixteen days. It was a 
wonderful trip. I found the 
Chinese people very friendly 
and gracious.

Mr. JewelMeacham Visits China On 18th Excursion

China Trip
My niece Mrs. Norma 

McBee and joined two other 
women form Texas, flew to 
San Francisco from Dallas 
where we met twenty-eight 
more people. We then flew 
to Beizing with a stop in 
Tokoyo. Beizing is the 
capital of China. It has 
a history dating back three 
thousand years. It’s one of 
the most beautiful and

tSanta Claus is
9*

teaming to the
Bank O f

Commerce!
Friday, N ov. 30

Candy Favors

9"
9*
9"
9*
9*
9*
9*
9*
9 *^ 9:30 a.m. - 3:00 p.m .

^ M r s . Claus will also be there to take pictures of each chid with Santa.
9*
9

For Everyone! 2

Ki ds, don’t forget to bring your list of Christmas reqiests. And 

remember he knows who has been naughty or nice.

< «
• «



the groom news
THE McLEAN NEWS

All ads cash with' or ter 
unless customer has an 
established account a ith 
The Groom or McLean 
News.

For Sale-Good, clean 
wheat straw for gardens or 
bedding. Call Darrell 
Whatley 248-7963.

74 Ford L.T.D. S8S0.00 or 
trade call Anthony’s Paint­
ing 248-7511.

Typist - $500.00 weekly at 
home! Information: Send
self-addressed, stamped 
envelope. Honey, P.O. Box 
6509, Charlottesville, VA. 
22906. .

For Sale-Red Brick veneer 
home, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 
2 blocks from school, 2 
blocks from town. Located in 
Groom at 210 Broadway 
Avenue. Call 248-7372 after 
6:00 p.m.

Printing , , .Call The 
Groom News 248-7333. 
Reasonable Prices, as you 
will find anywhere.

For Sale-160 acres, 
McLean area, cross-fenced 
to 40 acres, central water, 
good well, 1/2 miner rights, 
806-935-2607.

Wanted -someone to care 
for elderly couple 4 hours 
per day Monday through 
Friday preparing one meal 
and light house keeping. 
Contact Loretta 248-7034 
after 5:30 p.m.

For Sale-80 inch blade tan 
saw, 6 inch X 24 inch l*elt 
sander. call 248-7508 or 
Contact R.A. Snyder.

W hite Deer Land Muse un
in Pampa: Art show, Soi th- 
west Collection by Evel me 
Epps of Pampa. December 
5, through December 9, 
1:30-4:00 P.M. Come h»ve 
coffee with us and see his 
lovely western art.

New Shipment of Sweat­
shirts long and short sleeved 
T-Shirt, New colors in the 
crinkle cotton shirts.

Christmas Open House
Thanksgiving Weekend 

Country Junction 
248-7478

Congratulations to Janice 
Benoest-for being 1st. 
Winner of prize for finding 
the Scripture in 1 Samuel 
17:47. “The battle is the 
Lord’s Patsy Miller.

Wanting Wheat pasture. 
Call 874-3123.

For Sale-steel traps, 
chained together in pairs, 
with a drag on each pair.

Call J. Boyd Smith.
779-2257

Why Rent? Homes for 
$1.00, Repos. Gov’t give 
away programs! For infor­
mation 504-649-0670 Ext 
R-1725.

For Sale: Lawn mowers, 
roto-tiller, dinette set (6 
chairs and leaf), depth 
finder, inner tube for lake, 
skis, pick-up topper, lazy 
boy recliner, small desk, 2 
queen size sofa sleepers, gas 
grill, life jackets, etc. Call 
248-7337 if interested.

For Rent: 3 bedroom 
house with 2 bathrooms in 
McLean. Call 669-7224. .

*
No w Selling 

W inter Pasture

Cattle Insurance

Brumliy Insurance 
ilgency

Gf 00M , TEXAS
Johnny Brumley, Agent  

.O ffice  2 4 8 -1550 Home 2 4 8 -7 3 15,

STOP N SHOP Q
248-7977 Groom TEXACO

[Everyone’s Convenience Store 

Texaco

12 pk Coke Diet Coke

Dr. Pepper 7up 3.99

Pepsi
6pk

Shamrock Slaughter Plant 
Custom Slaughtering

1/2 beef, beef cuts, & pork 
Food Stamps Accepted

Open
Monday through Friday 

Closed 
Saturday

Phone 256-3241

St. Jude's Novena: May 
the Sacred Heart of Jesus be 
adored, glorified, loved and 
preserved throughout the 
world now and forever. 
Sacred Heart of Jesus, pray 
for us. St. Jude, worker of , 
miracles, pray for us. St. 
Jude, help of the hopeless, 
pray for us. Say this prayer 9 
times a day. By the 8th day, 
your prayer will be 
answered. Say it for 9 days, 
it has uever been knWC to 
fail. Publication must be 
promised. Thank you. St. 
Jude.

T.J.

Yard Clean up, tree, 
shrub trimming, deep root 
feeding. Kenneth Banks,
665-3672.

Nurse* Aides Positions 
Needed, variable hours and 
full and part time available. 
Example 10:00 p.m. to 6:00 
a.m. Tuesday only, paying 
$5.15 per hour plus meal, 
uniform and travel 
allowances.

We are also offering 
nurses aide certification 
course that is available to all 
interested persons in the 
Community, Please Contact 
Diane Hill for more more 
information Palo Duro 
Nursing Home, Claude.

Groom 1SD is interviewing 
applicants for cook in the 
c a f e te r i a ,  s u b m itt  
application to Kenneth 
Sweatt, Groom 1SD , Box 
S98, Groom, Tx. 79039 or 
Call 806-248-7557.

Groom

Flying Service

Craig Howard
AII Types of aerial applications

Good Service-Reasonable Prices

Harris & Office Craig
248-7561 248-7420

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

Near New topper for 
Chevrolet Long bed pickup, 
under 1988 model. Cal! 944- 
5250.

Public Notice
Request For Bids 

On Texas Highway 
Construction

Sealed proposals for con­
structing 165.643 miles of 
seal coat on various limites 
of Loop 79, FM 1526, FM 
280, SH 305, FM 1267, SH 
136, FM 687, FM 283, FM 
748, FM 1454, FM 2375, SH 
51, FM 2277, FM 2711, FM 
3004, RM 3260 and FM 
3303, in Hutchinson, Lips­
comb, Hemphill, Ochiltree, 
Roberts, Gray and Hansford 
Counties covered by CPM 
557-3-9, CPM 557-4-4, CPM 
557-6-9, CPM 582-2-12, 
CPM 582-3-8, CPM 790-7-9, 
CPM 791-3-13, CPM 
CPM 791-4-6, CPM 791-6-6, 
CPM 797-1-12, CPM 797-3- 
10, CPM 1339-2-14, CPM 
1861-1-9, CPM 1885-1-12, 
CPM 2127-1-6, CPM-1-10,
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CPM 3076-1-4, CPM 3460-3- 
5 and CPM 3495-1-2 will be 
received at the State Depart­
ment of Highways and 
P u b lic  T r a n s ­
portation, Austin, until 1:00 
p.m., December 11, 1990, 
and then publicly opened 
and read. Plans and specifi­
cations including minimum 
wage rates as provided by 
law are available for inspect­
ion at the office of Henry L. 
G a lle g ly , R e s id e n t 
Engineer, Dalhart, Texas, 
and at the State Department 
of Highways and Public 
Transportation, Austin , 
Texas. Bidding proposals 
are to be requested from the 
Construction division, D.C. 
Greer State Highway Build­
ing, 11th and Brazos Streets, 
Austin, Texas 78701. Plans 
are available through com­
mercial printers in Austin, 
Texas, at the expense of the 
bidder.

Usual rights reserved.

C aambe/iiain O T O R  C O M P A N Y

HIGHWAY 287 ClARENDON. TEXAS

BUICK • OLDSMOBILE

PONTIAC • CADILLAC • CMC TRUCKS
> Susan Brown Clarendon |806) 874-3527

248-6241 Amarillo 376-9041
Groom. Texas 79039 Texas WATS 1800) 692-4088

SATELLITE
SALES SERVICE

FINANCING AVAILABLE 
With Approved Credit

REMCO ELECTRONICS
H ITA CH I TV, VCR - CHAPARRAL • 
PA N A SO N IC • TOSHIBA • SHARP

273-6940 1- 800 - 827-6940

<WAPA>

MARK BIVENS 
(806) 246-7010

BIVENS AUTOMOTIVE
24 HOUR WRECKER SERVICE 

HWY 66 & TEXAS 
6R00M, TX 79039 

(806 ) 248-7471
JACK BIVENS 
(806)246-7966

Swanson Construction
Remodeling-Additions-New 

Home Construction-All Concrete 
Work-Metal and Asphalt 
Roofing-Ceramic Tiling- 

Carports-Cabinets
Call Larry at 779-3101 or -2950

QUARLES BODY SHOP
1 Body Pick Up & Delivery: Pointing

Frame within 30 miles All Work 
Rick Quarles, Owner Guaranteed

|  Bus:806-835-2523 Res: 806-835-2939 
b 100 E. 10th P.O. Box 371 Lefors, Tex. 79054
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Band Boosters Thanks Community

Ytxi and ycxr fam ily and fr ie n d s  a re  In v ite d  to an open 

m eeting o f  1 arpa  Masonic Lodge No. 966 A.F. & A.M. on 

THiraday, Ntvember 29, 1990 ac 7:00 P.M. Brother George] 

M, Clark w il 1 be honored w ith  the  p re sen ta tio n  o f  th e

a w rd  o f  the COLON TROWEL. P lease  p lan  to  a tten d  and 

b rin g  screen: w ith  you.

PUBLIC NO TICE
On July 19. 1990, GTE Southwest 

In< orporated ("GTE-SW") filed revi- 
sic ns to the company's tariff pertaining 
to the features and associated equip 
me nt for providing emergency number 
ser rices (9-1-1).

11 this filing, GTE-SW proposes to 
modify its existing 9-1-1 tariff and to 
adi more than 200 new service offer­
ing t. The new items of service and 
eqt ipment in this application have 
be* n added to meet the company's in- 
ctc ising 9-1-1 customer demands and 
to tllow  G T E  SW  to com pete m ore
efl xlively in the 9-1-1 equipment 
markeL

7 he product line in the new offerings 
cot sists of a mini-computer and spe 
cia ized console package for larger 
communities, as well as a personal 
computer with Automatic Number 
Ide tufication (ANI) display for smaller 
cot ununities. (ANI displays a caller's 
lel< phone number on the emergency 
dis catcher's computer screen.) In addi­
tion, the product line will include ANI 
an Automatic Location Information 
(Ai J) display units compatible with, 
an similar to, those offered by South - 
we .tern Bell Telephone Company and 
oth cr local exchange carriers in Texas. 
(Tie ALJ feature displays a caller's 
adi ress on the computer screen.) The 
rate charged existing 9-1-1 customers 
ma/ be revised at the expiration of 
the ir contracts with GTE-SW if the 
pre posed tariff is approved.

1 his filing has been assigned Docket 
No 9667. The hearing on the merits is 
sdi eduled for Fehrusry 25,1991, at the 
off ces of the Public Utility Conunis- 
sio i of Texas. The deadline lo inter- 
vere in this docket is December 31, 
19M).

Persons who wish to intervene or 
oth uwise participate in these proceed­
ing ; should notify the commission as 
soon as possible. A request to inter­
vene, participate, or for further infor­
ma ion. should be mailed to the Public 
Uti ity Commission of Texas, 7800 
Sht al Creek Boulevard, Suite 400N, 
Au tin. Texas. 78757. Further infor­
mal ion also may be obtained by calling 
the Public Utility Commission Con- 
sun er Affairs Division at (512) 458- 
0223or(512)458 0227.or (512)458 
0221, teletypewriter for the deaf.

•3TE Southwest 
incorporated

Bingo was a great success 
this year. We had a 
wonderful turn out. We want 
to thank all who came out 
and played to help support 
the Tiger Pride Marching 
Band. We all had a great 
evening we showed movies 
and cartoons for the kids and 
we had great refreshments 
that were donated by many 
great McLean Cooks. We 
had great prizes and the 
entertainment was provided 
by the McLean Cheerlead­
ers, Tiger Mania, Amy 
Ward and Her twirling 
students.

Thanks so much for all 
those who loaned us tables 
and chairs (McLean Fire 
Deparment and United 
Methodist Church), and 
everyone who helped get all 
this together. A special 
thanks to Brenda Galley who 
was in charge of getting all 
our prizes together. Thanks 
to Monty Joiner and Bill 
Thomas for calling out our 
numbers. We are grateful 
for the use of the Gerald 
Tate Ag. bam. Thanks to the 
moms who went several 
times to Pampa collecting 
prizes. Thanks for your out­
standing support.

New Arrival
Mr. and Mrs. Richard 

Curtis of Portland Oregon 
would like to announce the 
arrival of their son James 
Robert. He was born 
October 20, weighed in at 7 
lb. 7 oz. Grandparents are 
Jerrell and Pat Lee, Melvin 
and Jean Curtis of Portland. 
Great-grand Mothers are 
Mildred Hawkins of 
Lebanon, Ore. and Muriel 
Moore of McLean. Great- 
great grand mother Clara 
Rounsaville of Labanon, 
Or

New Arrival
Tyler Edward Stewart is 

proud to announce the 
arrival of baby sister. Briana 
Kay on November 4, 1990 at 
7:46 p.m. at Coronado Com­
munity Hospital in Pampa. 
She is 20 inches long and 
weighed 8 lb. oz.

Proud parents are Charles 
and Diana Stewart.

Grandparents are Felton 
and Faye Conners. McLean, 
Collene Stewart. McLean 
and Eddie Mac Stewart also 
of McLean.

Card Of Thank*
Brothern, it was an honor 

and a privilege to render 
grave side services for a 
fallen Bro. Earl Eustate of 
Clyde, Texas, a member of 
your lodge.

A funeral was Saturday. 
November 10, 1990 at 2:00 
p.m. in Elmwood Memorial 
Park in Abilene.

Sincerly, 
Alber Fletcher 

Secy Clyd Lodge 1056

B .„d  Booster Bingo Hall, Brenda Galley and 
Helper Darlis Joiner, Ten Rhonda Sparltn.
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November 30,1990 
10:00 to 5:00p.m.
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218 N. Main 

|806] 779-2611 
McLean, Texaa

Our Medicare Supplement Insurance 
is among the best...

good neighbor claim service
Ask About Health Insurance
The State Farm Way

GLEN COURTNEY
2  ̂00 Perryton Parkw ay, Pampa, Texas

PHONE: 685-4051 or 1-800-658-6303
Like a good neighbor, State Farm is there.

State Farm Mutual Automobile Insurance Company 
Home Office: Bloomington. Illinois

Nut pm n rd n l nr cndnnnJ the IIA 
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WHEELER-EVANS
ELEVATORS

Groom & Corner North

“W e are happy to be of service”

Phones: 248-7262  or 248 -7278  

C orner 248 7011

Nadine Thornton
248-7359

Groom, Texas


