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Republican congressional 
candidate Beau  'Boulter has 
officially declared his support for 
President Reagan's School 
Prayer Amendment. 

The amendment was before 
the U.S. Senate last week for 
consideration. It reads as 
follows: "Nothing in this 
constitution shall be construed to 
prohibit individual or group 
prayer in public schools or other 
public institutions. No person 
shall be required by the United 
States or by any state to 
participate in prayer." 

Boulter stated "Some people 
may wonder what impact one 
moment out of 61/2  hours (the 
length of the average school 
day) can have on an individual. 
The truth is that if the moment is 
impressively special, it can have 
a lifelong impact." 

Boulter quoted George 
Washington's farewell address 
when Washington said "Reason 
and experience both forbid us to 
expect that national morality can 
prevail in the exclusion of  

religious principles." 
"I find it very ironic that 

teachers can read any portion of 
the Congressional Record in the 
public school classroom except 
the opening prayer given by the 
Congressional Chaplain before 
the members of congress." 

"The constitutional guaran-
tees of freedom of speech 
protect a teacher who reads a 
passage from Marx's Communist 
Manifesto or Hitler's Mein 
Kampf, but the Supreme Court 
has held it unconstitutional for a 
teacher to read from the Bible." 

Even if the amendment does 
pass the Senate Boulter stated 
that it will have a difficult time 
passing the House. "The School 
Prayer Amendment is locked up 
in the House Judiciary 
Committee chaired by 
Congressman Pete Rodino. 
Rodino is against school prayer 
and refuses to hold committee 
meetings on the amendment, 
and as a result the amendment 
may never get to the House 
Floor." 

Boulter stated that- incumbent 
Congressman Jack Hightower 
knew full well how Rodino stood 
on the School Prayer 
Amendment when he voted in 
House Resolution 5 (January 8, 
1983) to approve Rodino's 
chairmanship. "A vote for Pete -
Rodino was a vote against school 
prayer." 

Boulter challenged members 
of Congress, including 
Hightower, to sign a discharge 
petition which would force the 
amendment from Rodino's 
committee directly to the House 
Floor where it could be voted on 
by each member. At least 218 
congressmen must sign the 
discharge petition. 

Opinion polls have shown 
wide public support for the 
amendment, especially in the 
south, but the House democrat 
leadership led by Tip O'Neill 
refuses to force the amendment 
out of committee and to the 
House Floor where there can be 
a forum for debate. 

THREE PIONEER FAMILIES pose with the old Motley County courthouse in the background. Mr. and Mrs. 
H.N. Ford are in center of the picture, which includes their children, and the Hyatt and Beauchamp 
families. Standing in back row, from left are Tom Hyatt, C.H. Harper, Sam Ford, Jim Ford, Walter Ford 
and A.D. Beauchamp; second row: Mrs. Tom Hyatt (Emma Wyatt), Mrs. C.H. Harper (Dollie Ford), Mr. and 
Mrs. H.N. Ford, Mrs. Ada Ford (Ada Randolph) and son, Jewel, Price Beauchamp and Mrs. A.D. 
Beauchamp, (Victoria Kennedy); Front row: Elmer (standing) and Corroll Hyatt, Alma and Bob Harper, 
Jonathan Lancaster, Mrs. Jonathan Lancaster (Ola Ford), Henry.  Ford, Seth Beauchamp and Nellie 

Beauchamp. The Ford family came to Motley County in 1897 from Jack County. 
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Boulter Declares Support 
For Prayer Amendment 
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College Students 

Floyd Hardin Joins 
Quarter Century Club 

Floyd Hardin, salesman in the 
Panhandle District for West 
Texas Utilities', recently 
completed 25 years of service, 
and is one of the newest 
members of the Quarter of a 
Century Club. 

Hardin began serving WTU in 
February, 1959, in Memphis. He 
moved to Matador in 1964, and 
presently serves as company 
salesman for that office and the 
Paducah and Crowell Offices. 

A native of Stamford, he 
graduated from Stamford High 
School in 1952. After working for 
Meads Bread Co. in Lubbock for 
several years, he served in the 
U.S. Army for three years before 
joining WTU. 

Harding and his wife, Janey, 
have two children, Kyle, a 
student at South Plains College 
in Levelland, and Kody, a senior 

A workshop dealing with the 
use of microcomputers in the 
home and on the farm and ranch 
will be held April 3-4 at the Texas 
4-H Center at Brownwood. 

Conducted by the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service of 
the Texas A&M University 
System, the workshop will focus 
on the basics of computer 
terminology and computer 
selection. In addition, an 
advanced session will be 
conducted to give those with 
some prior computer experience 
an insight into operating systems 
and basic programming 
procedures, announces Dr. 
Ashley Lovell of Stephenville, 
Exteniion Service economist. 

"The program is designed to 
help participants identify 
personal needs for computers, to 
learn basic microcomputer 

Floyd Hardin 

at Matador High School. 
He is a member of the 

American Legion Post in 
Matador. 

terminology, and to develop a 
set of criteria for selecting a 
computer," says Lovell. 

Open discussion will focus on 
family resource management 
and farm and ranch manage-
ment and will set the stage for 
subsequent talks on computer 
hardware and software. 

Special workshops will deal 
with preparations for 
computerized accounting 
systems, crop decision aids, 
electronic spreadsheets, 
marketing decision aids, data 
base management systems, 
livestock and dairying decision 
aids, and selection of a farm or 
ranch accounting system. 

Individuals interested in 
attending or in more information 
about the microcomputer 
workshop should contact Lovell 
at 817-968-4147. 

CHEESE & BUTTER 
Cheese and butter will be 

given away from 1 p.m. to 5 p.m. 
today (March 15) at the VFW 
building in Matador. 

* * * * * * 

State Representative Foster 
Whaley of Pampa will be 
released from Coronado 
Community hospital this week. 
He underwent emergency 
surgery March 5 for internal 
hemorrhaging . He will resume 
duties at his office after about 30 
days. 

* * * h 	* 

Dale and Carol Rector and 
brothers Bryan and Ryan of 
Alburquerque, N.M. are 
announcing the arrival of a baby 
girl and sister, Jennifer Byrnn, on 
March 12, 1984 at 9:41 a.m. She 
weighed 8 lbs, 12 oz. and was 21 
inches long. 

Grandparents are Lemma 
Rector of Matador and Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Zulouz of Overland 
Park, Kansas. 

* 	* * * * * 

Tracey and Kenneth Jackson 
of Levelland visited recently in 
Matador with their grand-
mother, Moette Jackson. 

* * * * * 

Cora Hall accompanied 
Minnie M. Markham, Osia 
Smallwood and Verda 
Neighbors to Plainview Tuesday 
to visit Mr. and Mrs. George 
McMahon. They stopped in 
Lockney at the Care Center to 
visit a friend, Mrs. Billie Self and 
wished her a "Happy 93rd 
Birthday." 

Cora and Minnie went on to 
Plainview to visit Miss Rockie 
Turner, and Ethel Ratcliff in 
Heritage Home. 

VOLLEYBALL TOURNEY 
The Junior Class of Valley High 

School will sponsor a Ladies and 
Men's Volleyball 'Tournament 
Thursday throught Saturday, 
March 29,30 and 31. I he fee will 
be $20. Contact Betty Tiffin or 
Betty Green at 455-1411 before 
March 26. 

Local merchants, preservation 
groups, civic clubs and other 
interested parties are urged to 
attend a Texas Main Street 
Program Workshop to be held 
April 3, in Tulia. 

The South Plains Association of 
Governments, in association with 
the Panhandle Regional 
Planning Commission, the Tulia 
Chamber of Commerce, and the 
Panhandle Historical Commis-
sion, is sponsoring the workshop. 

This workshop is designed for 
all those interested in 
revitalization of central business 
districts. The program will 
include Main Street programs 
and other areas of interest 
regarding downtown areas. 

Farmers and ranchers with 
one or more employees have 
until midnight March 16 to buy 
workers' compensation 
insurance or face very serious 
liability without common law 
defenses should they be sued by 
an injured employee, according 
to Ronald Richards of Matador, 
president of the Motley County 
Farm Bureau. 

Any farm or ranch employee 
injured after March 16 could 
claim his right to sue his employer 
if that employer does not have 
workers' compensation 
insurance, Richards said. 

He' pointed out that this 
situation came about as a result 
of the ruling March 7 by State 
District Judge Harley Clark of 
Austin that the exemption of 
farm and ranch laborers from 
workers' compensation is 
unconstitutional. 

Richards noted that any 
employer liability policy 

Glen, Calvert of Flomot has 
qualified for the National Junior 
College Athletic Association 
(NJCAA) Indoor Trach and Field 
Championships and will 
represent South Plains College 
March 2-3 in Fayettville, Ark. 

Calvert, a sophomore a SPC 
and former high school athlete 
from Motley County High, 
finished runner-up in the shot 
put at the 1983 NJCAA Indoor a 

Registration will be at 9:30 
a.m. and at 10 a.m. Anice Reed, 
Project Director of Texas Main 
Street Center will give a 
speech on "Texas Main Street 
Program." 

At 10:30 Dick Ryan, Architect, 
will discuss "Renovation of Small 
Commercial Buildings." At 11:00 
Kay Harvey Mosley will talk 

about "Window Displays" and a 
question and answer session will 
be at 11:30. 

Afternoon programs will last 
until 3 p.m. on other related 
subjects. For more information 
local residents may contact 
Frances Hobbs or Lucretia 
Campbell. 

(employer liability endorsement 
on farm and ranch owners, 
homeowners or farmer's 
comprehensive personal 
liability) covering farmworkers 
as approved by the State Board 
of Insurance states that it will not 
pay claims of injured 
farmworkers if they are covered 
by the workers' compensation 
law. 

President Richards stated that 
Texas Farm Bureau has and will 
continue to oppose removal of 
the exemption of farm and 
ranch employees from workers' 
compensation. The Texas 
Attorney General has indicated 
that his office will appeal the 
ruling. 

Pending final dispbsition. of 
this case, attorneys who have 
reviewed the judge's ruling have 
advised that the only safe course 
of action is for employers to 
acquire workers' compensation 
insurance immediately, Richards 
said.  

year ago. He will be the top 
contender to win the national 
indoor championship this year in 
the shot put. His best mark this 
season is 51-11/2. 

Calvert is a returning All-
American for the SPC Texans. He 
finished second in the nation last 
May at the NJCAA Outdoor 
Championships in the shot. 

"If everyone performs well, 
we should finish in the top 10 
teams," predicts SPC track coach 
James Morris. "We are looking 
forward to competing at the 
meet." 

Twelve SPC track and field 
athletes have qualified for 
nationals and will compete as a 
team. 

* * * * * 

Charles E. Cammack of 
Matador was among one 
hundred and sixty students in the 
College of Agricultural Sciences 
at I exas Tech University who 
made the Dean's List or 
8resident's List for the 1983 fall 
semester. 

To make the dean's honor roll, 
students must complete a 
minimum of 12 semester hours 
with a gradepoint average of 
3.5 or above on a 4.0 scale. The 
presidents's honor roll 
recognizes students who had a 
perfect 4.0 gradepoint average. 

at * * * * * * 

Kimberly D. Campbell of 
Matador, a sophomore political 
science major, has earned 
"Distinguished Student" status at 
Texas A&M University. 

Recipients of the "Distinguish-
ed Student" honor must earn at 
least a 3.25 grade point ratio, 
out of a possible 4.0, during the 
most recent grading period and 
must be registered for at least 15 
semester hours. 
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DAVID CHRIS SMITH, son of 
James Ray Smith, formerly of 
Roaring Springs, was named to 
the Kansas State All-Star High 
School learn and has signed with 
the University of Kansas at 
Lawrence for next year. He is the 
grandson of Mrs. James A. 
Smith. His father graduated 
from Roaring Springs in 1959. 

Computer Workshop Set 
April 3-4 In Brownwood 

  

Of Local 
Interest 

 

 

	I 

Texas Main St. Workshop 
Set For April 3 At Tulia 

Farmers, Ranchers Urged 
To Acquire Insurance 



Letter To Editor 
Matador tribune: 

Enclosed is a check for my 
renewal to the Matador Tribune. 
I look forward to getting the 
paper each week; it is like sitting 
down for a visit with a lot of old 
friends. 

Thank you for reminding me. 
Lorain Cargile Weathers , 
1106 E. Michigan 
Hobbs, N.M. 88240 

* * * * * * * 

Dear Matador Tribune, 
The 24th annual convention of 

Santa Rosa District, TFWC, will 
be held March 1a-17 at the Kiva 
Inn in Wichita Falls and will be 
hosted by the federated clubs of 
Burkburnett. Mrs. Erwin F. Soell 
of Iowa Park, Santa Rosa District 
President, will.  be the presiding 
officer. 

Club members from Matador, 
Memphis, Crowell, Paducah, 
Quanah, Vernon, Seymour, 
Burkburnett, Wichita Falls and 
Iowa Park will be in attendance. 

Activities will be initiated at a 

meeting of the executive officers 
at 4 p.m. March 16, and the 
annual banquet will be held at 7 
p.m. The featured speaker at the 
banquet will be Col. William 
Crofton (Ret.) of Kentucky, who 
will address the group on 

"Middle East Crisis." 
Presentation' of awards will 

precede the banquet and a 
reception honoring past 
presidents, life members and 
club presidents will follow. 

The general assembly of the 
convention will start at 9 a.m. 
March 17. The district officers 
and department chairmen will 
give reports. During the recess, a 
movie, "My Incredible Journey," 
travels of TWFC President Mrs. 
Juanita Bryant, will be shown. 

Reports of standing 
committees, special appoint-
ments and projects chairmen will 
be heard prior to the luncheon 
which will feature an address by 
Mrs. Sammie Skiles, TFWC 
President. 

The highlights of the 
afternoon session will be the 
Fashions for Fun and hat style 
shows and installation of officers 
for 1984-86 by Mrs. Philip 
Carpenter, honorary IFWC 
President. 

Thanking you for any publicity 
that you can give the convention, 
lam 

Mrs. Homer Blalock, Chairman 
Public Relations and 

Communications Santa Rosa 
Dist. 

YOUR NEAREST 

HER Block 
is located at — 

106 W. Missouri Floydada, Tex. 
Call 983-5233 

One Nation Under God  

Perspective And Opinions 
Columns • G  

Library Notes 

Tolkien; Unto This Hour by Tom 
Wicker; Free Fire Zone by Bob 
Riggan; Night Sky by Clare 
Francis; and The Log of a 
Cowboy by Andy Adams. 

Nonfiction arrivals: CIA by 
Brian Freemantle; Richard 
West's Texas; The Wagonmas-
ters by Henry P. Walker; The 
Howling of the Coyotes by 
Ernest Wallace; Prefaces by 
J.Frank Dobie; Prehistoric Man 
on the Great Plains by Waldo R. 
Wedel; The Dust Bowl by 
Matthew Bonnifield; Tour Guide 
to Old Western Forts by Herbert 
M. Hart; The Beginnings of 
Texas, 1684-1718 by Robert 
Clark; Journal of the Texian 
Expedition Against Mier by 
Thomas J. Green; Trip to the 
West and Texas by Amos 
Andrew Parker; An Uncommon 
Gift by James S. Evans; A Texas 
Cowboy by Charles Siringo; 
Mari Sandoz, Story Catcher of 
the Plains by Helen Stauffer; 
Guide to Texas State Agencies; 
and How Bills Become Laws in 
Texas. 

Local Items 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Groves, 

former Matador 'residents, left 
Wednesday to visit his brother 
and wife, Mr. and Mrs. Algie 
Groves of Quanah, after 
spending the week end here, 
during cross-country travels. 
Their current headquarters is 
Lubbock and this summer they 
will be in Montpelier, Vermont, 
serving as volunteer workers in a 
Baptis church there. 
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congratulations to Jan SUPRA 
01 gotan. leans for noosing 
me winning name first of 
Misters new 32 OZ. CUP In MO 
"NAME THE CUP CONTEST"14,  
"me 1011500" 

JAN SPARKS • $500 
WINNER 

USUP CUPS - COMING TO AN 
SUP'S NEAR YOU I 

nILLSUP 
CONVENIENCE STORES 

1)Soak white rice 20 minutes 
to remove the white polish 
before cooking. It tastes much 
better. 

2)Don't cook prunes. Wash 
good. Place prunes in quart jar, 
not too full. Cover prunes with 
water. Let the prunes stand in 
the refrigerator two days 
before serving. No food value 
is lost. 

3)If you are a youngster and 
want to be taller, do stunts or 
acrobatics. Your bones will 
stretch two inches. Do all these 
things before you are in the 
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Camels were brought into 
Texas in 1856 to transport 
supplies to army posts in 
desert areas of the South-
west. 

vicinity of 26 years old. While 
you are young your limbs are 
like a willow limb. After you re 
26 you are completely 
calcified. Your bones will 
break more easily. 

4)In your jewelry box, if you 
have a tangled chain, drop 
about four drops of olive oil on 
the chain. Untangle, wash 
good with soap and water, dry 
and lay in a layer of cotton. 

5)If you receive obscene 
telephone calls, tell them your 
telephone is monitored, to go 
ahead and talk. 

Birthdays 
March 17- David Thompson, 

Melea Taylor Read, Randy Pope, 
Pennie Keltz, Adelle Durham, 
Roy Tippin, Billy Shannon. 

March 18- John D. Russell, 
Whitney Jameson, Clay Weaver, 
Sibyl Barton. 

March 19-Buzz Thacker, Herb 
Martin, Eddie Marcum, Mindy 
Hillyard. 

March 20- Mary Ann 
Browning, Lou Degan. 

March 21- Karrie Winston 
March 22- Sherry Robinson, 

Geneva Martin. 

Anniversaries 
March 20- Joe Ike and Beth 

Ann Clay. 
March 22- David and Linda 

Reece. 

Name: 

Fddress: 

Yes, please enroll me as a 1984 Friend of the Motley County 
Library. I enclose $ 	  for a 

	  membership. 
(individual, family, supporting, business, club, patron, life) 

Send to: Motley County Library 
P. 0. Box 577 
Matador, TX 79244 

Make Check Payble to: 
Friends of the Motley 

County Library 

Page 2, Matador Tribune, Thursday, March 15, 1984 

By Terry J. Clements 
March is the last month of 

1984 general enrollment period 
for people who failed to sign up 
for Medicare medical insurance 
at their first chance. 

There is a general enrollment 
period during the first 3 months o 
each year. Also eligible to enroll 
at this time are people who 
once had medical insurance but 
who dropped this protection. 

Medical insurance protection 
will start July 1, 1984, for people 
who sign up during the general 
enrollment period. The basic 
monthly premium for medical 
insurance is $14.60 for the 
period ending December 1984. 

The basic premium is increased 
by 10 percent for each year a 
person could have had this 
protection but did not. 

The premium paid by those 
with medical insurance 
represents about one-fourth of 
the costs. the remaining amount 

Social Security News 

In general, after a person has 
had $75 in approved charges for 
covered medical expenses in a 
year--the annual deductible--
medical insurance will pay 80 
percent of the approved charges 
for any additional covered 
services a person has during the 
rest of the year. 

If you have a question 
concerning the general 
enrollment period for Medicare 
or any Social Security question, 
please call us at 293-4371. If you 
need to visit our office, our 
address is 1401-B West 5th St. in 
Plainview. 

is paid by the Federal 
Government from general 
revenues. 

Medical insurance helps pay 
for doctors' services, outpatient 
hospital services, and many 
other items and services not 
covered by the hospital 
insurance part of Medicare. 

BUTTER- 
MILK 1 /2  SAL 

BORDEN'S 	

$119 
A 	16 OZ. NR BOTTLES 

:1tst111 6 PACK $ 1 . 59 
SINGLES 4`1 ‘r EACH 

ASST. FLAVORS 	' 

BORDEN S 
VI/4REA11A ICE CREAM 
THE TALLSUP 

IS BORN I 

By Beverly Dorsey 
The Friends of the Library will 

be sponsoring a Bake Sale on 
Saturday, March 24, at Billy's 
Grocery. Any Friends member 
who would like to help may make 
a cake, pie, or "whatever" and 
bring it to the sale at 9:30 a.m. 
All proceeds from the sale will go 
to the Friends of the Library for 
purchase of books and other 
needed items for the Motley 
County Library. 

We appreciate the gift of the 
book, Pioneer Women In Texas, 
given by Mrs. Douglas Blackburn 
of Hobbs, N.M. We also thank 
litho Callaway and Renee 
Meyers for their donations of 
books. 

We also thank Betty Vandiver 
for her volunteer work in the 
library last week. 

NOTE: The library will be 
closed Thursday and Friday, 
March 23 and 24. 

New fiction arrivals: Tin Wife 
by Joe Flaherty; Leaving the 
Land by Douglas Unger; The 
Book of Lost Tales by J.R.R. 

'SFEDERAL 
CROP  INSURANCE  

Protecting your wayof 

Lee's Insurance 
Orville & Ruth Lee 
P. 0. Box 36 
Flomot, Texas 79234 
806 / 469-5370 

ST PATRICK'S 
SALE 

"PRICES EFFECTIVE 
MARCH 15-17, 1984 
• SELF SERY GAS • GROCERIES 
• OPEN 24 HOURS • EVERYDAY 
"THERE'S ONE NEAR YOU" 

C 

NOW AT ALLSUP'S 
ENLARGED PET 

SUPPLY CENTER 
ALLSUP'S FAST CONVENIENT 

MONEY '299" 
UP TO 

ORDERS EACH 

SHURFINE 5 LB 

Sugar 
$1.49 

11\:170  DORITOS 
REG.EX. CRISPY. NACHO CHEESE 

atIFWAAIrdhiruat 91Vel, Veit* A ysal(-‘44%A.AS-.1r44  IV* 

r- 

__TORTILLA CHIPS REM"  

ALLSUP'S COOKED FOOD SPECIAL AS FEATURED ON TV. 

CORN DOGS 	HEADY TO
ND  

GO ! 	2 FOR 
HOT A 

1/2  GAL. 
RN& CTN. 

FOLGERS 1 LB. CAN 

Coffee 
$2.59 

.44,  ii.a  T uA KISTRn 1/2   6 OZ. CAN  

RATH SMOKEY MAPLE 1 lb 

Bacon $1.59 

agai. 

Friday Special- Fried Fish, 

Stuffed Shrimp and Oysters 

Saturday Night Special- Mexican Food  

Carry-Out Orders 
Call 347-2266 

Branding Iron 
Restaurant 
Open Daily 
10:30 a.m. 

Helpful Hints 
By Catherine Henderson 

Have You Joined The FRIENDS? 
conditioner for the library 
facility, paint and other 
materials for decorating the 
facility, a clock for the library, 
and funds to help with the 
Children's Summer Reading 
Programs for the past 3 years. 

Any individual or group who 
pays dues ($2 to $100) is a 
FRIEND, sharing with othert 
interested citizens the belief that 
a library must be supported 

ANNUAL MEMBERSHIPS-
(Dues and contributions are 
deductible for income tax 
purposes)- Individual $2.00; 
Family $5.00; Supporting 
$10.00; Business Firms, 
Organizations, and Civic Clubs 
$25.00; Patron $50.00; and Life 
$100.00. 

beyond the limitations of a tax-
supported institution. 

Friends of Motley County 
Library was organized to 
promote the welfare of the 

C 
Library and to encourage all 
citizens to make fuller use of the 
opportunities their library offers. 
Funds received by FRIENDS from 
dues or from -selected projects 
are used solely for Library needs 
beyond the budget provided by 
the county and cities. FRIENDS 
has provided books, an air 



Mr. and Mrs. Scott Read 
(Melea Taylor) 

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Fulkerson 

EX-LAX; "The Family Friend; 
helps your body help itself. 
Ex-Lax helps get your body's own natural rhythm 
going again. Gently. Dependably Overnight That's 
why mom families use Ex-Lax—
Chocolated or Pills—than 
any other brand. Make 
it your Family Friend. 

Read label and follow di,ecsont 
0 Ex-Lax, Inc., 1983. 

Reopening 
March 17, 1984 

Riverside Produce 
and Fleamarket 
Highway 70, three miles south 

of Roarin S•rin•s  
iii/ ../ / / 

Fres Fruits 
and Vegetables 
Fresh Country Eggs 

Open 9 a.m. to 7 p.m. 

We accept food stamps. 

• 

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Fulkerson 
of 1204 Smith were honored 
February 5 with a reception at 
the Northside Baptist Church 

Fellowship Hall in Odessa, on the 
occasion of their 50th Wedding 
Anniversary. Hosts for the event 
were their children. 

They have one daughter, 
three sons and six grandchild-
ren. Their daughter and her 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Laird live in Paragould, 
Arkansas. Lisa Laird Miller, a 
granddaughter, and her 
husband Robbie Miller live in St. 
Amant, Louisiana. Their 
grandson Jimmy Laird and his 
wife Beverly live in Jonesboro, 
Arkansas. 

Their sons and families are Mr. 
and Mrs. Hubert Fulkerson, 
Susan and Mitchell of Alvin, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bruce Fulkerson of 
Mendinghall, England and 
BruCe Jr. of Alaska, Mr. and Mrs. 
George Fulkerson and Monte of 
Amarillo. 

Most of these loved ones were 
present to enjoy this special day. 

Lloyd Fulkerson and the 
former Lillie Eudorah Witcher 
were married February 3, 1934 
at Quitaque in the Methodist 
Parsonage with Rev. O.M. 
Addison officiating. 

After 50 years of marriage, 
Lillie was radiant, wearing a 
sheer mauve dress with 
accordion pleated skirt. Her 
contrasting burgandy shoes, 
bag and silk rose corsage made 
a lovely ensemble. 

The registration table was 
draped with a white linen cloth 
and held a floral arrangement 
of yellow and gold mums, a gift 
from Bruce and his family. 

A poem, thanking everyone 
for helping to make this day so 
memorable, was printed in gold, 
rolled in scrolls and held by 
miniature gold wedding bands. 
A scroll was given to each of the 
over 120 guests who registered 
in the 50th Anniversary Album. 
Susan Fulkerson and Sherry 
Lewis presided at the 
registration table. 

Crystal and gold appoint-
ments decorated the refresh-
ment table which was draped 
with a gold cloth and white lace 
overlay. A floral arrangement of 
gold roses and daisies, gift from 
their daughter and families, 
served as the centerpiece. 

A golden bride and groom 
topped the beautiful three-
tiered white iced cake, 
decorated with roses of gold and 
yellow confection and placed on 
a crystal base. On each side of 

First United Methodist Church 
was the setting Sunday 
afternoon, March 4th, for the 
exchange of wedding vows 
between Melea Yvette Taylor 
and Scott Wesley Read. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. James W. Taylor of 
Matador. Mr. and Mrs. Truitt 
Read of Matador are parents of 
the groom. 

John Prestridge, •uncle of the 
groom, and Rev. Eddie Marcum 
officiated at the double ring 
ceremony uniting the couple in 
marriage. 

A large arrangement of white 
gladiolas, white stock, gerberia 
daisies, and greenery was 
centered in the altar area. 
Candelabras decorated with 
baby's breath, "Forever Yours" 
pink carnations, and greenery 
flanked the kneeling bench. Also 
in the altar area was a pedestal 
holding a unity candle inset with 
a picture of the couple which 
they lit at the conclusion of the 
ceremony. Aisle markers were 
"Forever Yours" gerberia daisies 
and English Ivy. 

Escorted to the altar by her 

anniversaries, children and 
grandchildren were arranged in 
large frames and sitting on 
stands for easy viewing and 
happy reminiscing. 

A wedding picture and a 50th 
anniversary picture were on 
either side of the piano with all 
the couple's beautiful cards 
displayed below. Plants and cut 
flowers received as 'gifts 
decorated the fellowship hall. 

Other special people who 
attended from out of town were 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Laird of 
Buchanan Dam, Mr. and Mrs. 
J.D. Craven and Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
McCagh'ren all of Matador, Mr. 
and Mrs. Nolan Fulkerson of 
Lubbock, Mrs. Bessie Fussell of 
Alvin, Mr. and Mrs. James Miller 
and their daughter Cara of 
Robert Lee.  

father, the bride wore a formal 
gown of white lace, The fitted 
bodice was accented with 
beaded Venise lace motifs and 
featured a Queen Anne 
'neckline. Leg-of-mutton sleeves 
were finished at the wrists with 
Venise lace. The natural waist of 
the gown fell to a full skirt of 
tiered Chantilly lace and silk 
organza ruffles and swept to a 
semi-cathedral train. 

,Her double layered illusion 
veil was gathered to the back of 
a Chantilly lace Juliet cap and 
fell to fingertip length. Her 
fewelry was a strand of matched 
pearls given to her by the groom 
and matching pearl earrings. 
She wore the traditional blue 
garter and carried a white linen 
handkerchief which belonged to 
the groom's maternal 
grandmother. 

The bride carried a bouquet 
of miniature white carnations 
and white stephanotis 
surrounding two white 
gardenias. She presented a pink 
silk rose to her mother as she 
approached the altar and 
another pink silk rose to her 
mother-in-law as the couple left 
the church. 

At a table with baskets of rose 
rice bags and thank you scrolls, 
guests were registered by 
Debbie Read, sister of the groom 
from Lubbock. Brent Campbell 
and Coke Barton were ushers. 

Mrs. Howard Traweek, 
organist, played a medley of 
wedding selections as guests 
arrived. "Ice Castles" was 
played as the candles were lit by 
Renee Renfro and DeAnn 
Phillips. DeAnne Parker sang 
"Love Lift Us Up" accompanied 
on the piano by John Griffith. 
She also sang "The Rose" and 
"Surround Me With Love." 

Kelli Taylor attended her sister 
as maid of honor. Holly Hobbs 
and Carlo Christian were 
bridesmaids. All of the 
attendants wore identical 
dresses of fuchsia moire taffeta, 
each fashioned with an off the 
shoulder ruffle and floor length 
skirt. They also wore a strand of 
pearls presented to them by the 
bride. Each carried a long stem 
"Forever Yours" gerberia daisy 
and wore a daisy wrist corsage. 

Vic Read served as his 
brother's best man. Jamie 
McNeill and Darrell McCravey of 
Crosbyton served as grooms-
men. The bridegroom was 
attired in black tails, and his 
attendants wore black tuxedos. 

Leigh Ann Pipkin was flower 
girl, and Cobey Turner served as 
ring bearer. 

Following - the ceremony a 
reception was held in the 
fellowship hall. The bride's table 
was laid with a white satin cloth 
overlaid with tulle caught with 
flowers and greenery tied with 
fuchsia ribbons. A three tiered 
cake with a champagne fountain 
base, a crystal punch service, 
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and the bride's bouquet were 
featured on the table. 

Presiding at the table were 
'Mrs. Gale Stafford and Mrs. 
Dean Turner. The groom's table 
was laid with a fuchsia cloth 
overlaid with white lace caught 
up with flowers and greenery 
tied with fuchsia ribbons. Debbie 
Read poured coffee from a brass 
service, and Mrs. Kelly Meyer 
served the german chocolate 
groom's cake. Guests served 
themselves fruit kabobs from a 
pineapple centerpiece. 

Grandparents attending were 
Rollie Partridge of Afton, 
maternal grandfather of the 
bride; Mr. and Mrs. James E. 
Taylor of Matador, paternal 
grandparents of the bride; Mrs. 
Delphene Young of Lubbock, 
maternal grandmother of the 
groom; and Mr. and Mrs. Mack 
Read of Dumont, paternal 
grandparents of the groom. 

After a wedding trip to 
Ruidoso, New Mexico, the couple 
will make their home in Matador 
until August when they will enroll  

at Texas Tech University. 
Melea aylor and Scott Read 

were honored with a rehearsal 
dinner March 3, hosted by Mr. 
and Mrs. Truitt Read, parents of 
the groom. 

Following the rehearsal, 
guests were served in the 
fellowship hall of the church by 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Johnson 
and Mrs. Gale Stafford. 

The serving table was laid 
with a white cloth over a taffeta 
skirt and featured a basket of 
fuchsia rose rice bags as 
centerpiece. The dessert table 
featured a white cloth, hand 
crocheted by Mrs. Mack Read, 
grandmother of the groom. The 
dining tables were decorated 
with milk glass bud vases filled 
with pink hydrangeas. 

Special guests included the 
members of the wedding party, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Prestridge, 
Rev. and Mrs. Eddie Marcum, 
Mrs. Delphene Young; Mrs. 
Burnett Young, Mr. and Mrs. 
Howard Traweek, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Dean Turner. 

Texas Highway Department 
established the travel trails 
according to locations, such as 
the Brazos Trail, Forrest Trail 
(including the Big Thicket), 
Forts Trail, Hill Country Trail, 
including the home and home 
country of President Lyndon 
Johnson, Independence Trail, 
Lakes Trail, Mountain Trail, 
Pecos Trail, Tropical Trail and 
Plains Trail which covers this 
area. 

Mrs. Dickson read "A Prayer 
for Older People," for the 
closing Inspirational Thought. 

Mrs. Una Simpson was 
hostess for the meeting, and 
although unable to attend due 
to illness, she provided 
refreshments and table 
decorations. Mrs. Ted Elliott 
served in her stead. 

The decorations featured a 
St. 'Patrick's motif with 
leprechauns, a rainbow, pot of 
gold and doubloons scattered 
about. Refreshments of finger 
sandwiches, cake squares with 
green icing, nuts and mints, 
and hot punch were served to 
Mesdames R.W. Overstreet, 
Gus Bird, Douglas Meador; 
Miss Mary Keith, Mmes. 
Hamilton, Pohl, Dickson and 
Elliott; and guests, Mrs. Eddie 
Marcum, Mrs. Robin Darsey 
and Mrs. Keith Patton, 
assistant librarian. 
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Taylor-Read Vows Exchanged 

the large cake were two heart-
shaped cakes with Lloyd and 
Lillie's names printed in gold 
confection. 

A crystal punch bowl with 
golden punch complimented the 
arrangement. Presiding at the 
table were the four daughters of 
Mr. and Mrs. L.H. Hight, Krista, 
Melissa, Mrs. Tina Watson, and 
Mrs. Teresa Sen•ri: ' 

Others who assisted were 
Paula Kirk and Mesdames 
Arthur Kirk, Robert Walker, 
Truman Fox, Robert Brown, R.V. 
Hight, L.H. Hight, John Lewis, Roy 
Overton, all of Odessa. 

A highlight of the event was a 
picture gallery featuring the 
couple, their children and fifty 
years of precious memories. The 
pictures were arranged on two 
long tables covered in white 
linen cloth. Pictures of many 

Lloyd Fulkersons Honored 
With Odessa Reception 

  

Frame 	Stucco 

All Types Interior & Exterior Painting 

Kenny Griggs 
Paint Contractor 

All Work Guaranteed 

Best time to call is 6 p.m. 
Rt. 3 Box 138 

Phone AC 806-983-5668 	 Floydada, Texas 79235 

 

Texas Heritage was the 
program theme for El Progresso 
Club March 8, when the 
organization met at the Motley 
County Library with Mrs. 
Robert Dickson as leader. 

The president, Mrs. John 
Hamilton presided and Mrs. 
Frank Pohl served as secretary 
and also presented the 
program, featuring the Texas 
Governor's Mansion. a film 
describing Texas Travel Trails, 
narrated by former Governor 
John Connally, was shown by 
Mrs. Robin Darsey, librarian. 

Mrs. Ditleson led the club in 
singing several Texas songs: 
The Eyes of Texas, Deep in the 
Heart of Texas, and Texas, Our 
Texas, with casio accompani-
ment by Mrs. Pohl, who was 
joined by Mrs. Dorsey for a 
saxophone and casio duet. 
Mrs. Pohl then displayed 
posters showing the interior of 
the governor's mansion in 
Austin and the renovations 
made during the adminstra-
tion of Governor Bill Clements. 

The film strip, titled "A State 
of Mind," gave an overall view 
of scenic areas across the state 
along the ten travel trails. 
"Texas is more than a 'state of 
mind' with its stormy past and 
dynamic future," observed the 
narrator. 

To assist travelers is seeing a 
part of the state at a time, the 

Texas Heritage Highlights 
El Progresso Club Program 



Valuable Coupon 
This Coupon Good For 

$5.00 
on any purchase of $10 or 
more. One coupon per 
purchase. 
4.../  Good Thursday, Friday, & Saturday 

NDERS01VS 
DEPARTMENT STORE 

Matador 

WEST TEXAS UTILMES COMPANY 

If you are counting on SoCial 

Security for a comfortable 

retirement .... count again! 

For example: 

Total Income 
IRA Deduction 

 

Without With 
IRA 	IRA 

$30,000. $30.000 
0 	2,000 

 

Adjusted Gross Income 	$30,000 828.000 
Deductions and Exemptions 	8,000 	8,000 

Taxable Income 	 $22,000 $20,000 
Income Tax 	 $ 3,737 $ 3,191 

10546 less in taxes) 

The dollars just don't add up! 

Inflation, high interest rates, 

unemployment, government 

deficits, economic uncertainties. 

Can you afford to count on 

Social Security? 

SOUTHERN FARM BUREAU LIFE'S 

"NO LOAD" FLEXIBLE PREMIUM 

RETIREMENT ANNUITY IS DESIGNED 

FOR THE IRA AND KEOGH PLAN 

Deduct up to $2,000 to an IRA and up to 

$30,000 to a Keogh Plan! 

Call your Farm Bureau 
Insurance agent 	 

he can give you that 
good feeling of security. 

Motley County 
Farm Bureau 

Mike Smith 
Box 88, Matador 'Phone- 806-689-2343 

ISM Fagg VALUES 
Barbeque on Bun 	$1.09 

Cokes 

$1.49 6 PK 

ergEnjoycz  

Trade mark C) 

Matador Red X 
Your Business is Appreciated 

What you know and teach your children about electric power lines 
could save a life — yours or your child's. 

Alert your children to the dangers of flying kites, model airplanes or 
toy rockets near electric lines. Instruct them to use wood-and-plastic 
or all-plastic kites with dry string. Always fly kites or other flying toys 
in open areas. If something does become entangled with overhead 
wires, do not try to get it down, leave it there. And never touch any 
dangling strings or wires. Call West Texas Utilities for assistance or 
for more information al‘out safe electric living. 
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County Agent's Corner 
Obituaries 

Howard Rice, 82 

reg. $2.49 

Preston 

Sour Cream 
894 8 OZ carton 

Hot Only, Limited 

By Ray Minkley 
JR. STOCK SHOW 

Motley County 4-H and FFA 
youth are getting ready for the 
Jr. Stock Show to be held March 
26. Last Saturday a grooming 
and showmanship practice was 
held for steer owners. It went 
well with nearly all the steer 
exhibitors attending. They got a 
chance to see the other steers 
and how theirs were going to act 
away from home. They also 
practiced setting their calves up, 
leading them, and watching the 
judge so they would be ready at 
all times. 

We hope to have a lamb 
sheering and showmanship 
practice this Saturday. 

The new show barn and wash 
room are coming along very well 
and should be ready for use 
soon. It will be an asset to the 
school and the Jr. Stock Show 
and appreciated by those that 
use it. 

Don't forget the heifer show 
this year. Anyone living in Motley 
County owning land in Motley 

March 15-23 
BREAKFAST 

Thursday, 15th- Orange 
Juice, Sausage, Waffle, Syrup, 
1/2  pt. Milk. 

Friday, 16th- Grape Juice, 
Bacon Toast, Jelly, 1/2  pt. Milk. 

Monday, 19th- Orange 
Juice, Cereal, Toast, 1/2  pt. Milk. 

Tuesday, 20th- Apple Juice, 
Cereal Toast, 1/2  pt. Milk. 

Wednesday, 21st- Grape 
Juice, Scrambled Eggs, Biscuit, 
Y2 pt. Milk. 

Thursday, 22nd- Orange 
Juice, Bacon, Toast, Jelly, 1/2  pt. 
Milk. 

Friday, 23rd- Fruit Punch, 
Sausage, Puffs, Syrup, Y2 pt. 
Milk. 

LUNCH 
Thursday, 15th- Bar-B-Q 

Beef Tips, Steamed Rice, Green 

Patton Springs School 
Principal, Rollie McNutt, 
announced that the following 
students have made the "A" and 
"B" honor rolls for the fourth six 
week period. 

"A" HONOR ROLL 
Kindergarten- Joshua Adair, 

Becca Bridge, Kassidy Karr, 
Jamie Long, Roy Perryman. 

1st Grade- Tommy Long, 
Chad Williams. 

2nd Grade- Clayt Bridge, 
Kalico Karr, Richelle Adcock. 

3rd Grade- none. 
4th Grade- none. 
5th Grade- Carol Jackson, 

Stephanie Mayfield, Rhonda 
Smith. 

6th Grade- Angela Burkes, 
Carolee Hughes. 

7th Grade- Dana Mullins. 
8th Grade- Sylvia Adair, Gail 

Jackson, James Lewis, Kristy 
Patrick. 

9th Grade- none. 
10th Grade- Esther Zarate. 
11th Grade- Sheila Lewis. 
12th Grade- Jackie Adair,  

County, or youth eligible for the 
Jr. Stock Show may show 1 or 2 
heifers, 12-18 months of age. 
They will not be shown at halter 
or weighed. 

There will be pens provided. 
Separate classes are provided 
for Straightbred, Limousin, Cross 
and other crossbred heifers. 
Lewis Bostick is the Heifer Show 
Chairman. 
TEXAS CATTLE GRUB SURVEY 

I would like to thank those 
producers who completed the 
cattle grub survey forms and 
returned them. The information 
has been compiled and sent to 
the Entomology specialist at 
A&M. It should aid them in their 
work with parasite control. 

RIFLE CLUB 
The 4-H Rible Club will meet 

this Thursday at 4:30 p.m. Ronnie 
Vandiver will be splitting the club 
into two groups to be meeting on 
alternate Thursdays. There are 
too many to all shoot on the same 
day. Parents are welcome to 
come watch. 

Lunchroom 

Menu 
Beans, Roll Pears, V2 pt. Milk. 

Friday, 16th- Frito Pie, Ranch 
Style Beans, Greens, Peaches, Y2 
pt. Milk. 

Monday, 19th- Taco Roll, 
Spanish Corn, Spinach, Mixed 
Fruit w/Topping, 1/2  pt. Milk. 

Tuesday, 20th- Ham, 
Blackeyed Peas, Scalloped 
Potatoes, Roll, Apple Cobbler, Y2 
pt. Milk. 

Wednesday, 21st- Chili Dog, 
Cheese Sticks, Hash Brown 
Potatoes, Applesauce, 1/2  pt. 
Milk. 

Thursday, 22nd- Taco 
w/Cheese, Lettuce, Tomatoes, 
Ranch Style Beans, Pears, Y2. pt. 
Milk. 

Friday,. 23rd- Sloppy Joe, 
Macaroni and Cheese, Green 
Beans, Peaches, Y2 pt. Milk. 

Lillian Atkinson, Micki Perryman. 
"B" HONOR ROLL 

Kindergarten- Stacy Cline, 
Linda Cooper, Michael Fulmer, 
Edward Lewis, Angela Silvas. 

1st Grade- Richard Lawson, 
Alfredo Silvas. 

2nd Grade- Ray Charles 
Fulmer, Shane Roberts. 

3rd Grade- Tammy Cooper, 
Dana Mayfield, Robert 
Quillamaco, James Adcock. 

4th Grade- Charles Ray 
Fulmer, James Niblock Cooper. 

5th Grade- Billy Bob Bumpus, 
Stephen Jones, Tina Tilley. 

6th Grade- none. 
7th Grade- Brent Atkinson, 

Kim Cline, Sharon Fulmer, Jason 
Slaton. 

8th Grade- Jerren Slaton. 
9th Grade- David Niblock. 

10th Grade- Mitzie Lindsey, 
Theresa Little. 

11th Grade- Jody Karr, 
Danny Kautz. 

12th Grade- Yolanda Kautz, 
Shannon Slaton. 

Funeral services for Howard L. 
Rice, 82, who died Thursday, 
March 1 in Albuquerque, were 
conducted at 2 p.m. Monday, 
March 5 in Central Baptist 
Church with Dr. Don Wheat 
officiating. 

Funeral rites were by the semi-
military branch, Canton High 
Plains number four of the 
Independent Order of 
Oddfellows. Interment was in 
Lawn Haven Memorial Gardens 
under the direction of Steed-
Todd Funeral Home. 

Mr. Rice was born Aug. 17, 
1901. He married Daisy Bartlett 
on Nov. 14, 1931 at Roaring 
Springs and moved to Clovis, 
N.M. in 1944. He was a member 
of Central Baptist Church and 
Clovis Oddfellow Lodge number 
31. 

He was a Lieutenant Colonel 
in the military branch of that 
lodge and had received the 
highest honor, the Decoration of 
Chivalry. He had worked for 

Eight members attended this 
week's meeting of the Motley 
County Arts & Crafts Club at 
Leona McKelvey's home, for an 
all day gathering. 

The members, after painting a 
deer on glass, voted to go to the 

The Plainview chapter of 
Parents Without Partners is 
having an Open House Sunday, 
March 18 from 2 to 7 p.m. 

The meeting will be held at the 
Rotary Club House in the park 
south of Furrs Cafeteria and will 
feature fellowship, games and a 
meal beginning at 5:30 p.m. 
Cost of the meal is $2.50 for  

Farmers Electric Coop for 37 
years. 

Survivors include his wife, 
Daisy of the home; one daughter 
and son-in-law, Eva Louree and 
Charles Sherwood of Albuquer-
que; four grandchildren, 
Charles V. Sherwood of Sicily, 
James W. Sherwood, Thomas E. 
Sherwood and Janet M. 
Sherwood all of Albuquerque; 
three brothers, Joe Rice of 
Clovis,Raymond Rice of 
Brownwood, and Olen Rice; four 
sisters, Elva Cochran of 
Brownwood Thella Jarrett and 
Leta Foust of Lubbock, and Ora 
Stonecipher of Roaring Springs; 
also numerous nieces and 
nephews. 

Pallbearers were Lonnie W. 
Bussey, Joe B. Rice Jr., Claudie 
Wayne Jarrett, Billy Ray Pierce, 
Leon Jarrett and Junior Cochran. 
Honorary bearers were Melvin 
Walker and all employees of 
Farmers Electric Coop and all 
Oddfellows not in uniform. 

arts display in the Civic Center in 
Lubbock on March 30. 

Those wishing to go on the trip 
may contact June Keltz. The 
group will leave from Mrs. Keltz's 
place at 10 a.m. 

adults and $1.50 for children. 
March is National Member-

ship Month and the local club of 
Parents Without Partners would 
like to urge members and 
prospective members to attend 
and enjoy the afternoon with 
people who have common 
problems caused by death, 
divorce or separation. 

Coupon 
Preston Milk 

$2  19h coupon 

Patton Springs Honor Roll 

2",S1406c40W111 

Robert M. Dickson 
Candidate For Hospital Board 

20 years experience as 
Hospital Administrator 

Member of American College of 
Hospital Administrators 

Member Texas Hospital Association 

Your vote will be appreciated. 

Vote April 7 

Arts & Crafts Club 
Plans Trip To Lubbock 

Parents Without Partners 
Plan Plainview Meeting 

CLI P AN D $AVE 

ma/ 

Regular only with this coupon 
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NOTICE: Ettective Marcn 15. Matador Red X will no 
longer accept credit cards. This includes Kerr McGee, 

Visa, Master Charge or any other kind. 

Remember `:,efg annuli. you With electric energy, 
but only YOU can use a Safely. 



SNELL 

GALLAGHER 

Power 

Fencing Systems 

E.A. Day 

347-2724 

Box 83 

Matador, Texas 

The banjo is the United 
States' only true native mu-
sical instrument. It was first 
developed in the 1790's. 

WINTER 
OVERCOAT. 

Don't Go Out Without It. 
01983 9.11. 90889 Consumer Products 

Dipisori,n1.1110FICI, 	23230 

ORDER FOR 
TRUSTEE ELECTION 

Motley County 
Independent 
School District 

Whereas the term of 
office of Roy G. Hobbs, 
James Taylor and 
unexpired term of 
Donna Thompson, 
members of the Board 
of Trustees, will expire 
on the first Saturday in 
April, 1984, said first 
Saturday being April 7, 
1984, an election for 
trustees is ordered for 
that date. 

The purpose of the 
election will be to elect 
to the Board of Trustees 
of said School District 
two (2) trustees for three 
(31 year terms, one (1) 

for a two year term. 
Attest: Bobby G. 

Williams, Secretary, 
Board of Trustees, Roy 
G. Hobbs, President, 
Board of Trustees. 

Members: Roy G. 
Hobbs, Bobby G. 
Williams, Donnie Cruse, 
Guy Campbell, James 
W. Taylor, Stanley 
Martin, 

"Feel the dignity of a child. 
Do not feel superior to 
him, for you arenot." 

Robert Henri 

The Matador 
Tribune has been 
authorized to an-
nounce the following 
candidates for public • 
office: 

State 

Senator 

Ray Farabee 

(Re-Election) 

Motley 

County 

Sheriff 

Alton Marshall 

(Re-Election) 

Frank Williams 

(Pete) 

County 
Commissioner 

Precinct 1 
John M. Russell 

(Sonny) 

(Re-Election) 

Luther B. Green 

County 

Commissioner 
Precinct 3 

Bill Jameson 
(Re-Election) 

Joseph Simpson 
(Gid) 

FOR THE SMILE 
OF HEALTH. 
#44ALL NATURAL.. 

VBEBa G- 

  

lot Sal HePatka 

  

  

FOR ANNOYING 
COUGH AND 

TSTRY
UFFY NOSE 

TRIAMINIC-Dre 
COUGH FORMULA 

GOVERNMENT 
JOBS: Thousands 
of vacancies must 
be filled immediately. 
$17,634 to $50, 
112. Call 716-842-
E000, Ext. 34309. 

8-2tp-9 

JOBS OVERSEAS 
Big money fast. 
$20,000 to $50, 
000 plus per year. 
Call 1 -716-842-
6000. ext. 22113. 

1 1-2tp-12 

If you run out of dishwash- 
ing liquid, a few teaspoons 
of mild shampoo will help. 

QUILT 
ANY TIME, 
ANYWHERE 
Now, you can relax and en-
joy your quilting when and 
where you have the time by 
using the Lap Quilting 
method. 

Yes, if you love to quilt by hand, but don't have the 
space for a large quilting frame, then follow this 
method of quilting on a small portable frame in your 
lap. You just pin individual blocks onto a collapsible 
tapestry frame and then sew backing, batting and 
quilt top together. Using this technique you can ac-
complish a great deal in a short time, because your 
work is always available to pick up. You can work on it 
whenever you have a few minutes-even travel with 
it. Order your copy today. 

The twenty-five projects in Lap Quilting offer 
something for quitters at all levels. So don't delay. 

TO ORDER: Send your name, address, zip code and 
$6.95 plus $1.25 postage and handling to American Melody, 
123 South Street, Oyster Bay, NY 11771. NY residents add 
appropriate sales tax. Please print clearly. 

SAVE! Order two for $13.00 plus $1.90 postage 
and handling. 

TV DIRECT FROM SPACE TO YOUR HOME 

Motley County 
Satellite System 

Contact 
Tom Bowman 

Financing Available 

SATELLITE SYSTEM 

System includes 101/2 ' Hastings Antenna, 24 
channel satellite receiver, low noise amplifier. 

Statill2SINSICICSIMPROh 

Available For 

Income Tax Reports 
Opal Pipkin 

Tax Practitioner 
Telephone 347-2747 	Home 347-2316 

Making Family life More Fun 

The first American coin bearing the image of a foreign 
monarch was the Isabella silver quarter issued for the 
World's Columbian Exposition in Chicago in 1893. 
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Card Of Thanks - $2.50 

DEADLINE FOR ADS 

NOON TUESDAY 
Classified Section Of Matador Tribune 

This Feature Sponsored By 

OUR THANKS 
The family of R.E. 

"Poppy" Campbell 
appreciates all the 
kind deeds, cards, 
flowers, food, visits-, 
phone calls, and all 
sympathies extend-
ed to us during the 
loss of our father 
and grandfather. 

We are grateful to 
each one who gave 
us comfort and 
support in our time 
of need. Thank you. 

R.E. Campbell Jr. 
Forrest Campbell 
and Families. 

Motley County 
Clinic 

347-2641 1 

Charles H. Hudson,111, 
D.O. 

At Motley Clinic 
Monday-Wednesday 

Robert M. Brodkin, 
D.P.M. 

• Pediatric Medicine S 
surgery 

Roy Tippin, R.N. 
Family Nurse 
Practitioner 

In Motley Clinic Daily 

Clinic Hours: Monday thru 
Wednesday 8:00 OJT. to 5:00 
p.m. Thursday: 8:00 a.m. to 
8:00 p.m. Friday 8:00n a.m. 
to 1:00 p.m. 

THE COUNTRY PARSON 

"Justice is allowed to sleep 
wLen folks who should be 
heard are being quiet." 

NOTICE OF 
COUNTY 

HOSPITAL 
ELECTION 

Notice is hereby 
given that an elec-
tion will be held in all 
precincts of Motley 
County on Saturday, 
April 7, 1984 for the 
purpose of electing 
three (3) directors 
for the Motley 
County Hospital 
District. 

Said election shall 
be held at the 
following places: 
Courthouse in Mat-
ador; Flomot School 
Building; Northfield 
School Building; and 
Depot Building in 
Roaring Springs, 
Published in the Matodo 

Tribune March 1st and 22nd, 

1984. 

FOR SALE: Yamaha 
250 Motorcycle. 
Excellent condition, 
2,900 miles. Cheap. 
Bobby Williams 
347-2355. 

1 1-2tp-12 

FOR SALE: Good 
used color TV Sets. 
Some with new 
picture tubes and 
new guarantees. 
Thacker Supply 
Company Roaring 
Springs. 

ctfn 

FOR SALE- Regis-
tered Angus Bulls. 
Two, four, five and six 
year-olds. Ready for 
service. Bigham 
Angus Ranch, Afton, 
Texas. (806) 689-
2369. 744-6191 or 
795-2649. 

(17) -ctfn 

IOC COPIES 
See Ray Zabielski 

or call June Tilson for 
more information. 

HELP 
WANTED 

March Ceramic 
Greenware spe-
cials- 25% off on 
canister sets, pit-
chers, cookie jars at 
Two J's, Turkey. 
(28) 	10-2tc-11 

DO YOU OR A 
Loved One have a 
drinking problem? 
We can help! Call 
348-2341, or 347-
2830. Confidential. 

ROLLING PLAINS 
WELL SERVICE 

Matador, Tx. We 
specialize in wind-
mills and submer-
sible pump repair 
and custom welding. 
We appreciate your 
business. Bobby 
Simpson 347-2202. 
Kelly Meyer 347-
2739. Travis Jame-
son 347-2473. 

NEW CARPET 
Cleaning Machine 
now available for 
rent at Bob Stanley 
Pharmacy. 
56 	 -ctfn 

NOW AVAILABLE 
at Matador Motor 
& I mpl. Professional 
windshield installers 
are at Matador 
Motor & Implement 
every two weeks. 
Guaranteed not to 
leak. Call 347-2422. 

Representatives For 

MONUMENTS 
AND 

CURBING 
Seigler Funeral 

Home 
Phone 

347-2626 

HOUSE FOR SALE 
Only 5 years old. 
2181 square feet. 
Two BR, 21/2  bath. 
Two car garage, 
large basement. Sits 
on 200'x150' lot in 
Southeast Matador. 
Call 347-2839. 

14 	 -ctfn 

HOUSE FOR SALE 
Two bedroom, one 
bath. One car garage. 
Hal Martin 347-
2359. 
(25) 	9-5tc-13 

REOPENING 
March 17, Riverside 
Produce and Flea-
market. Highway 70, 
three miles south of 
Roaring Springs. 
Fresh fruits and 
vegetables, fresh 
country eggs. Open 
9 a.m. to 7 p.m. We 
accept food stamps. 
(29) 	11-1tc 

WANTED 

WANT TO BUY 
A tiller. Dorothy 
Russell 347-2855. 

1 1-2tp-12 

FOR SALE 

SOUVENIER 
ISSUE 

75th Anniversary 
Editions of the 
Matador Tribune 
printed in August 
1966. Available at 
the Tribune office. 
501$ each. One dollar 
if mailed. Box 490, 
Matador, Texas 
79244. 

Notice of Rate 
Change Request 

General TelephOne Company 
of the Southwest. in accor-
dance with the Rules of the 
Public Utility Commission of 
Texas. hereby gives notice of 
the Company's intent to imple-
ment a new schedule of rates 
In Texas. effective March 28, 
1984 

The proposed changes in 
rates will affect at the Cam-
pany's• 829.291 Texas 
customers who represent al 
customer classes, and are 
designed W increase the Corn,  
Pany's gross intrastate 
revenues by $84,777.000. or 
approximately 13,34 percent 
annually. 

Persons who wish to in: 
tervene or otherwise par-
liciPate in these proceedings 
should notify the Commission 
as soon as possible. A request 
to intervene, participate or for 
further information should be 
mailed to the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas, 7800 
Shoal Creek Boulevard. Suite 
400N. Austin, Texas 78757. 
Further information may also 
be obtained by calling the 
Public Utility Commission Con-
sumer Affairs Division at (512) 
458-0223.1512)458-0227, or 
(512) 458.0221 teletypewriter 
for the deaf.  

A complete set of revised 
rate schedules has been filed 
with the Public Utility Commis-
sion at Austin, Texas, and is 
available far public inspection 
in each of the Company's 
Business Offices in the State of 
Texas. A summary of the Com-
pany's rate' filing has also 
been sent to the Mayor's office 
of each affected Municipally. 

General 
Telephone 

LOCKNEY MEAT 
COMPANY: USDA 
Inspected. Kill days, 
Monday through 
Friday. Custom 
Processing. Whole-
sale and retail meat. 
One half and quar-
ters, cut, wrapped, 
frozen and fully 
guaranteed. Located 
on corner of U.S. 70 
and FM 378 South. 
652-3305. Sam and 
Kelly Fortenberry. 

22-ctfn 

FANTASY CAKE 
1 cup butter 
1 1 lb. package marsh-

mallows 
3 qts. popped Jolly Time 

Pop Corn 
1 cup peanuts 
1 cup M & M's chocolate 

candies 
1 cup gum drops 

In a large saucepan, melt 
butter and marshmallows 
together over low heat. In a 
large, deep bowl, mix all 
other ingredients; add the 
butter-marshmallow mix-
ture and stir well. Pack in 
well-greased tube pan. Cool 
i n 	refrigerator. Remove 
from pan. Cut into wedges 
at serving time. 

POP CORN BALL 
CLOWNS 

1 cup butter 
1 1 lb. package marsh-

mallows 
2 cups popped Jolly Time 

Pop Corn for each clown 
pointed ice cream cones 
- 1 for each clown 
large gum drops 
M & M's chocolate candies 
8" paper doilies - 1 for 
each clown 
styrofoam cups - 1 for 
each clown 

Melt butter and marsh-
mallows over low heat re-
serving small amount for 
gluing; fold in 2 qts. popped 
corn (enough to make 8 pop 
corn balls). Shape into 3" 
diameter balls. Let .t until 
firm. Face: Attach M&M's 
to ball using reserved marsh-
mallow mixture to make 

FOR SALE BUSINESSE 
SERVICE 

HOMES 
FOR SALE 

CARD OF 
THANKS 

THANK YOU 	APPRECIATION 
I want to express 	I want to express 

my gratitude for the my appreciation for 
cards, flowers and all the cards, phone 
prayers in my behalf calls and other acts 
while I was in the of kindness I receiv- 
hospital. 	 ed while I was in the 

I appreciate the hospital and when I 
words of encourage- arrived home. 
ment and the acts of 	We appreciate all 
kindness. Thank you your thoughtfulness. 
to all of you who 	Dora Watson 
helped in any way. 

Wilma Hobbs 

"When a banker says it ain't the money, but its the 
principle of the thing...you can bet its the money!" 

First State Bank 
Your "Hometown" Bank - Member FDIC 

eyes and nose. Cut a U. 
shape out of large gum drop 
for mouth and glue in place. 
Ears: Attach a large gum 
drop toeach side of-  head. 
Hat: Attach 3 M&M's in a 
vertical row to ice cream 
cones. Smear marshmallow 
mixture around cone rim and 

p
ress gently to top of head 
ntil firm. Collar: Fold doi-

ly in half, half again, then 
fold in half again. Unfold. 
Gather up center and twist 
into 1" stem. Spread out 
edges to form ruffle. Stand: 
Cut off top 3" of styrofoam 
cup to form a ring. Place 
doily on ring; place clown 
on top of doily. 

A pop corn ball maker, 
available exclusively from 
Jolly Time, forms perfect 
pop corn balls fast and easy. 
No burned or sticky fingers. 
To order, send $1.00 for one 
or $1.75 for two along with 
name, address and zip to: 
Jolly Time, P.O. Box 178, 
Sioux City, Iowa 51102. 

A recipe folder featuring 
20 recipes for pop corn lov-
ers, plus a "how-to" crafts 
section also is available by 
sending the pennant from 
any Jolly Time product or 
254 to cover postage and 
handling to the above men-
tioned Jolly Time address. 

Pop Corn And Birthdays-A Perfect Combination 
Looking for a birthday 

party idea sure to delight 
youngsters? A pop corn 
theme is just the answer. A 
pop corn fantasy cake, real 
enough to top with birthday 
candles, and pop corn ball 
clown favors for each guest 
to take home and eat, are 
novel and attractive yet easy 
and inexpensive to make. 



Tip Steak SIRLOIN 
BONELESS LB. 

V-8 gOCKTAIL 
Juice 

is  S'PAK 29 
6 OZ.  CANS  
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EARTHTONE Et WHITE PAPER 
TOWELS 

	

°11.11,41°. 
	 Hi-Dr' 

	

111-DRI 	LABS
' 00 

ROLL 

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF 

Round 

Steak 

LB. 
HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BONELESS CUT  Steak  CENTER 	$2" 
HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF 

BONELESS TENDERIZED 
Cube Steak 	LB. 

Ground 
EXTRA LEAN FRESH 	5.9  

Gu  
APART= Beef  61% LEAN 

LB. 

KRAFT RED. CAL OR REG. BTTRMLK 
CATAUNA ITALIAN FRENCH 

Dressings POURABLE 	 89c 

Wolf 794 
Chili WITH BEANS

15 OZ CAN 

NESTLE'S CHOCOLATE 

Quik 

CAN
2 LB.

$289 

	

$249 
OSCAR MAYER SLICED LUNCHEON80z 	I 

Meet 	 PKG. 
$ 1 	9991 $249  HORMEL'S OLD FAS/11130 sPaD 

Briskets  24 LB. AVG. 	LB. 

GREEN GIANT SLICED OR WHOLE 69  
Mushrooms  JAR 
100% NATURAL SPAGHETTI 	 
Sauce PREGO 

KRAFT PARMESAN 	
8 OZ $249  Cheese 	CAN.  

Ags  

Spaghetti 
12 OZ. 69c 
PKG. 

SKINNER THIN 

32OZ. 169 JAR 

59c 

BOX 1 LB. 9 99  

BAG 1 LB. 199 
DOWNY FLAKE 
Waffles 	'OK OGZ. 79c 
KRAFT HALFMOON CHEDDAR OR 
Chebile Horns SIKOGz..'L"  
SHURFINE ORANGE;LIME, 	e  Auk 
Sherbert  PINEAPPLE SiCTN. GAL •K,  wry 

LA CREME WHIPPED 
Topping 	8T81189c  

BOOTH COD 
Fillet 
BOOTH PERCH 
Fillet 

FOLGER'S 
Flaked 
Coffee 

9 9 
13 OZ. 
CAN 

TOWELS 

Handi-Wipes 

30° OFF LABEL DETERGENT 

Palmolive$149 
12 Liquid 32 OZ. 

BTL. 

DrTeppen 
lhe most originnal lift drink,Dr. Pepper, 7 Up 

Diet Dr. Pepper, Pepper Free 
6 PACK 12 02 CANS 	$ 

READY TO SPREAD 

Betty Crocker $129 
Frosting 	16 AN.  OZ. 

C 

BETTY CROCKER SUPER MOIST 

Layer Cake 

1181 89c  

• 
3 LB. 

rise
$249 

ALL VEGETABLE SHORTENING 

Pure 
risco CAN 

MAXI CUP SOFT 

Parkay 

29 
1 LB 

30° OFF LABEL ACTION PLUS 

Dynamo 
32 OZ 

$ 1 79 

BTL. 

1 LB. 
TUB 

HEALTH it BEAUTY AIDS 

INTENSIVE CARE 
Vaseline 
Lotion 15 O BTL. 

CALIFORNIA SUNKIST 
NAVEL 

ranges 

3 .a'1 
Q•7IP 

Cotton 	
79 Swabs 300" BOX LB. 49

CALIFORNIA GREEN 
` Avocados 	3 FOR 

CALIFORNIA SUNKIST 
Lemons  
WASHINGTON D'ANJOU 
Pears LB. 

49c  liEgLLu0aWsSir tHIATN

NECK OR LB. 49c 

50r OFF LABEL WITH FABRIC 
SOFTENER 

Fab 
84 OZ $2" 
BOX 

're proud 

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES  

you more 
to give 	en tire 

the price fighter 

F 0005 	 WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS WE ACCEPT MANUFACTURER'S COUPONS 
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