
Three cases of exhibits from 
Mexico are now featured In West 
Texas museum an the campus. 

The first case holds a collection 
of Mexican dolls and three models 
dressed in Spanish regalia. The 
Toluca Indian doll, made by To- 
uca women to represent their own 
dross, is sold in the market. A 
Chihuahua vaquero Is standing be-
side the Indian figure. A. Mexican 
straw doll and several Huastecan 
models complete this( collection, 
contributed by Jane Holde n. 
daughter of Dr. W. C. Holden, cur-
ator. 

The first model Is dressed in a 
buckskin suit with a huge Mexi-
c sombrero heavily decorated 
with gold braid lying by his side. 
Another model is wearing a suit of 
unbleached muslin with a height 
embroidered shawl around his 
shoulders. The shirt is buttoned 
with the front parts of the shirttail 
tied together in the front. The last 
model is wearing the national cos-
tume of Mexico, a white blouse 
heavily embroidered and a red 
skirt with designs woven out of 
various colored sequins. Around 
thuemr ew awl.% t ids 

designed 
gnb riegdh tt osasr rnT hb lee  cos- , Techsans Donate 

W. shipwrecked before reaching 
gown of a Chinese princess, who Almost $1,500 To 
Mexico. She was picked up with 

ar Fund Drive some of her baggage, but all her War  

Elizabeth "Umpy" Robinson was 
elected "Miss Texas Tech" in the 
student run-off election Monday, 
and will represent the college in 
the contest for "Miss Lubbock." 

One hundred and twenty-six 
candidates were nominated for 
"Miss Texas Tech" Tuesday, Oct. 
10 in student balloting sponsored 
by the Tech Chamber of Com-
merce. The primary election was 
held Friday, and ten girls were se-
lected from the 126 candidates to 
enter the run-off election. 

The final candidate selected from 
Lubbock will be entered in the con-
test for "Miss Texas-in-the-War" 
which will be held in Waco Mon-
day, Nov 13. All expenses for the 
contestant to go to Waco will be 
paid, and the candidate chosen as 
"Miss Texas-in-the-War" will re-
ceive a $500 war bond. Interview 
with movie directors, and a 
write-up in Life magazine. 

Election of "Miss Lubbock" will 
be held Nov. 1 at the Lindsey 
theatre, Woody Tire company, and 
Dunlap's department store. 
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Youthful Minister Prepares 
At Tech For Future Career; 
Started Preaching at 12 
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La Ventana Beauties Chosen 
Museum Features "Umpy" Robinson 16 To Be Selected 
Mexican Exhibits Wins "Miss Tech" In Tuesday Election 

Dolls, Models, iivaraches 
Received In Cellec#ion Title In Election 

HE Groups Hold 
Area Meetinas 

, On Tech Campus 
The National Scholastic Press as- 

cations from various institutions 
were classified according to the 
type of school, ftequency of issue. 
enrollment of school and type of 
sevice. 

This is the second highest rating 
ceorded a publication of this type. 

The only time the paper exceeded 
this rating was in 1939 when the 
Toreador, edited by Reeves Henly, 
was given the Pare Marker award. 
This citation means that it was 
the most outstanding paper of its 
kind in the nation. It received 
first class rating In 1943 with Bill 
Barnett serving as editor. The 
Toreador won All-American recog-
nition in 1936, 1937, 1939. and 1941. 

Textile Dept. 
Purchases New 
Friction Meter 

A friction meter has been pur-
chased by the textile department to 
teal meffizitmcy of friction in 
a wide variety of fabrics. The 
frictional properties of textile fi-
bers, yarns, and fabrics have to be 
taken into consideration by both 
manufacturers and users of fab-
rics, according to Lucille Finley. 
research assistant. Fabric smooth-
ness, "sheen," "creep," and wear 
are very important characteristics 
associated with the frictional pro-
perties. 

Development of new fibers and 
finishing agents for fabrics creat-
ed u need for adequate means to 
evaluate their characteristics. The 
friction meter is designed to give 
fabrics an numerical rating, and at 
the same time meet the require-
ments of ruggedness, sensitivity 
and ease of operation that are es-
sential in any instrument to be us-
ed in routine textile testing. 

Moreover, the new device can be 
used to determine the coefficient of 
friction in a number of fabrics, 
evaluate finishing agents, and con-
trol processing with respect to the 
frictional characteristics of fabrics. 
The friction meter has been appli-
ed to the testing of cotton per-
sales, broadcloths, poplins, twills, 
sateens, rayon crepes. spun rayons 
of linen-like and challis-like finish, 
wool and mixed wool-rayon uni-
form shirtings and suitings, and 
knit Rubrics including war-knit 
rayon dress fabrics and nylon hos-
iery. 

The friction meter was develop-
edduring a recent research pro-
ject sponsored and directed by a 
special committee for testing of 
textile finishes. The actual work 
was conducted at the National Bu-
reau of Standards by Dr. E. C. 
Dreby. The knowledge of the in-
vention was not released until this 
summer. 

Fall Directory 
Now Completed 

Fall semester directory of stu-
dents. faculty and college employ-
ees has been completed by the 
registrar's office. The directory 
contains an alphabetical index of 
the faculty, including their posi-
tions, offices. Lubbock addresses 
and telephones.  

The student index includes the 

home address, Lubbock address. 

Lubbock telephone number. class 
and the division In which the stu-
dent is enrolled in college. 

Directories are on sale for 25 
cents and may be obtained at the 
registrar's office or at the Tech 
bookstore.  

Dr. Ling is Guest Speaker 
At Honor Society Meeting 

Chinese customs and modes of 
living were discussed by Dr. B. C. 
Ling Friday when Freshman Hon-
or society met for the first pro-
ream of the year Officers are: 
Elizabeth Schmidt, president, Mary 
Findley, vice president, Betty Ren-
ner, secretary, Dorothy Cliff, treas- 
urer. Barbara Bedford, reporter, 
and Maxine Harp. program chair- 

Two area meetings of state home 
economics groups will be held on 
Tech campus next weekend, says 
Dean Margaret W. Weeks. 

A meeting of the West Texas 
Home Economics association will 
be held Friday evening, Oct. 27. 
from 7 to 10:30 o'clock in the Agri-
culture auditorium. Fifty-six coun-
ties are included in the area, ac-
cording to Miss Weeks, and five 
area meetings are replacing the 
state meeting this year. 

Dr. Erect S. Eppright, president 
of THEA and head of the depart-
ment of home economics at TSCW, 
will preside over business. "Home 
Economics Programs and Post 
War Plans" is to be discussed by 
Miss Josephine Pazdral, state su-
pervisor of home economics for 
high schools. Miss Geraldine Cle-
well, assistant professor of home 
economics at Tech, will direct a 
panel discussion on housing, rural 
and project. A summary, given by 
Miss Esther Sorensen. oistrict home 
economics supervisor, concludes 
the program. 

This area meeting will be spon-
sored by the Lubbock county Home 
Economics association. with Mrs. 
Gladys K. Holden as chairman. 

The second meeting is an area 
nutrition conference sponsored 
jointly by the State Nutrition coun-
cil and the Tech home economics 
division. It will be held Saturday. 
Oct 28. 

The morning session, from 9:15 
to 12:30 o'clock in the auditorium 
of the Agriculture building, will 
feature as principal speakers Miss 
Vivian Drenckhahn, field consult-
ant for the nutrition programs 
branch of the War Food admin- 
istration, and Dr. Eppright. They 
will speak on needs of this area 
and ways of meeting these needs. 
Mrs. J. N. Michie, head professor 
of foods and nutrition, will have 
charge of the morning session and 
Dean Weeks will give the 

session 

ing address. There will be a lunch- 
eon at 12:30 o'clock at which Miss 
Sorensen will preside. 

Group meetings, to be held from 

c 
1:3

m 
 0 to 3 p. m. in the Home Eco- 

nois building will use the fol-
lowing topics for discussion, (1) 
organizing an active nutrition 
committee and finding Its problem; 
.2) how to interest people in 
nutrition program; and (3) mea-
aruing the effectiveness of com-
munity nutrition program. Fol-
lowing the meetings there will be 

summarization by Mrs. Eliza-
beth McGuire, health education 
consultant of the Texas State 
Board of Health, at which Dr. 
Mina Lamb, associate professor of 
foods and nutrition. will preside. 

Each group will be conducted 
by a leader chosen for her abili-
ties in these specific fields, and 
there will be a consultant for each 
group. Consultantsare Misses 
Gladys Short, district supervisor 
of vocational home economics; 
Margaret Barrett, professor of 
home economics, WTSTC; and Dr. 
Marion Bell Wiesen, Lubbock 
county War Food committee. 

The public is Invited to both 
morning and afternoon sessions of 
the ,meeting. 

Pre-Law-IRC Club Will Send 
Delegates To Conference 

Pre-law-lite club met Monday 

night and the following committee 

was appointed to work out plans 

regarding the nature of the organi-

zation and the programs which 

will be undertaken' Patti Hall, 

Patsy Smith, Bodes. Burkham, 

Mary Mixon, Edwin Brahaney, and 

Robert Lawn Cole. 

Programs on current interna-

tional problemswere suggested, 

m and plans were ade for a num- 

ber of mock trials. Members will 
be chosen to attend a conference 
this spring which is sponsored by 
the Carnegie Endowment for In-
ternational Peace. 

The club will meet again Mon-
day at 7 p. m. in the Administra-
tion building, room 302, 

Met Soprano On 
Artists Course 
Thursday Night 

Eleanor Stein., soprano from the 
Metropolitan Opera company, will 
be presented by Tech Artist course 
Thursday evening in Lubbock High 
school auditorium at a o'clock, an-
nounces R. A. Mills, chairman of 
the artist course committee, today. 

Miss Steber, one of the youngest 
members of the Metropolitan Op-
era company, is beginning her fifth 
season. Her career began when she 
won the role of Senta in "The 
Flying Dutchman" at the .Boston 
Opera house. She was elected 
soon afterward to play the leading 
soprano part in "Jack and the 
Beanstalk," Louis Gruennerg's mo-
dern opera version of the old fairy 
tale. 

More recent roles, however, have 
been as Marguerite in "Faust" and 
as the Countess Aimaviva in "The 
Marriage of Figaro." Miss Steber 
has sang, also, on the radio in the 
Hostelanetz "Pause That Refresh-
es" shun, tne "Fuld flour," broad 
casts of the New Toik Philharmo-
nic symphony andon her own 
daily program, "Your Horny Front 

Season tickets, general admission 
and reserved seat tickets will be 
on sale at B. E. Adair Music com-

pany, 1012 Main. High school stu-

dents and all college students who 

have not purchased season tickets 
may buy single admission tickets 
for 91.50, which includes federal 
tax. 

Among other artists to be pre-
sented this season is Kurt Baum. 
Metropolitan Opera tenor, who will 
appear Nov. 29. Second semester 
presentations will include Mia Sla-
venska and dance ensemble of 
eight pople, appearing Feb. 21, and 
Patricia Travers, violinist, who is 
scheduled for March 26. 

By MARY LATCH LATHAM 
Toreador Staff Writer 

When others doubted his sai 
cerity, 12-year-old Jerrel Gaddy ask-
ed permission of a landlord to 
preach the gospel to the Negro 
hired hands on a Plains farm ne, 
Goodland. While other youths at 
the age of 18 groped blindly fin 
some field to follow the Reverend 
Gaddy entered Texas Tech as 
junior transfer from Wayland 
junior college holding a full time 
pastorate at the Cone Baptist 
church near Lubbock. 

Jerrel was preaching before hr 
heard of there being a "call to 
preach." He is told that he began 
playing being a preacher from a 
soap box when he was four. When 
12 years of age. Gaddy and his 
mother listened to the teachings of 
the Volunteer Mission band from 
Wayland junior college which came 
to speak at the Goodland school. 
He and his mother were both con- 
verted. 

Jerrel received no encouragement 
from his father. who was non-
Christian at the time, he announc-
ed his intention to preach; but his 
later conversion was pinnacle ex- 
perience in his ministry. He had 
very few opportunities in his twelve 
years to attend Sunday school or 
Church and none of his elders took 
him seriously. Not even a preach- 

field
encouraged him In his chosen. 

field. 
Jerrel begun his preaching when 

12, was licensed to preach when 13. 
and was ordained to the ministry 
at 15 years of age. 

Only once did Jerrel ever doubt 
his decision to preach. The day' 
after his ordination his decision 
loomed larger and larger in his 
mind. At sunrise that day Jerrel 
started riding the farm tractor and 
was to be relieved in mid-afternoon 
by his father who would plow late 
into the night. As the day matured 
Jerrel wrestled with his decision. 
Was he equal to the challenge" 

the design was made with thumb 
prints, seater jars. vases, a wine 
decanter and glasses made from 
bubble glass and many pieces of 
drawn work. 

Residents of the Home Manage-
ment house had as their guests 
Tuesdayevening Miss Martye 
Poindexter and mother, and Miss 
Doris Nesbitt and mother. 

Rey. Jerrel Gaddy 

Was it too great? The fear of the 
unknown numbed his senses, his 
courage dwindled. When his father 
came to relieve him he unsaid an- 
nounce his decision. He did not 
feel equal to the task. But his 
father was late. Finally, his head 
bursting with the turmoil of in-
decision, Jerrel slid from the 
tractor to his knees and prayed 
as he had never prayed before. 
The light came. 

When 15 yea, of age he entered 

Wayland junior college and im-
mediately became pastor of the 
Red Hill Baptist church near Plain-
view. In March 1913 he became 
pastor of Hick, Chapel, resigned 
at Red Hill and accepted pastorate 
of the Cone church in February of 
1944 (both the Cone church and 
Hicks Chapel being half time 
pastorates,. In September, 1944. 

Miss Thormann Writes 
Housing Project Article 

"Home Counseling'n Housing 
Projects" written by Miss Vera 
Thormann, home economics grad-
uate, has ben published in the 
October issue of the Journal of 
Home Economics. 

Training. duties and problems of 
the home counselor are discussed 
in the article. New living condi-
tions arising from the war effort 
create difficulties, she says, in nu-
trition, child care and interior de-
corating. 

when both these churches became 
full time pastorates. Gaddy resign-
ed the Hicks Chapel church and 
r
v
emained with the Cone church. 

i.hich permitted him to enter Tech. 
While commuting in his car from 

his temporary residence at West 
hall to his pastorate, Jerrel never 
neglects an opportunity to pick up 
a hitrh-hiker, black or white. Here. 
he rays, is a rich field for evangel- 
is. Reaching for a much-used 
New Testament which he con-
stantly keeps in his shirt pocket, 
Gaddy related this experience: 

"Once I gave this away. It was 
iin Christmas day 1943 to a soldier 
hitch-hiker. He was cursing when 
I ',irked him up. He had not writ-
ten his parents in four months and 
was down on the world In general. 
He noticed my brief-case and ask-
ed me if I was a traveling sales-
man. Then came mine and God's 
turn. Becoming a new convert, he 
needed the Testament more than 
I that day, I gave It to him. 
The Testament vise later returned." 

Summers, too, are very full for 
the Rev. Gaddy. Last slimmer he 
was In five revivals and taught 
over 100 boys at Cede Glen Bap-
tist camp in Palo Duro canyon. He 
baptised 32 persons at Hicks chapel 
during his IR months of ministry 
there. 

Physically fit, mentally alert and 

strong in faith, youthful Reverened 

Gaddy faces a torn world squarely. 

Realizing the necessity of an edu- 

cation, he expresses himself thus. 

"Any dull ax will cut Wood: but 

look hpw_much more wood a sharp 
ax will cut. I hoer planned seven 
years of college work and a doctors 
degree." 

Speaking with wisdom and pat-
ience far beyond his years. Rev. 
Gaddy expressed his philosophy in 
this final quotation: 

"If I am faithful with the little 
things of life, greater things will 
surely be offered." 

Extension Division 
Offers Three New 
Courses Here 

Three num -  courses have been 
started by the division of exten-
sion. Director J. H. Millikin an-
nounces. The first course is a class 
in interior decoration, meeting 
Tuesday evenings at 7 o'clock, in 
room 106 of the Home Economics 
building. Miss Edith Coleman of 
the division of home economics is 
the instructor. This Is a non-credit 
course while the other two are of- 
fered on a 	lit and non-credit 
basis. The e. 	'eat fee for each 
course is 315. -iighteen studnts are 
enrolled in the interior decoration 
course, Millikin said. 

Conversational Spanish classes 
are being conductedan Monday 
and Thursday evenings from 8 to 
9:30 o'clock in room 214 of the Ad-
ministration building. Prof. T. 
Earle Hamilton is instructor. Four-
teen students have signed for this 
course, it was announced. 

First meeting of the extension 
clam in conversational French, 131. 
was held Wednesday evening at 
7:30 o'clock in room 221 of the Ad-
ministration building. Professor 
Edgar T. Ruff is the instructor. A 
request for this course was made 
by a group of Lubbock women, 
Millikin stated. 

Marines Sought 
For Overseas Duty 

Four women for ove. seas duty 
in the Marines and four 17-year-
old boys are needed to fill the pre-
sent quota, according to Sgt. Char-
les W. Clarke, local Marine repre-
sentative. This is the first time wo-
men have ben sought for over- 
seas duty. 

The 17-year-olds will sign now 
and be called in February. This 
will allow them to finish the pre-
sent semester. 

Those interested should apply at 
the Recruiting office, room 217 in 
the post office building. 

Home Economics Club Plans 
Halloween Party Friday 

Announcement seas made Tues-
day of a Halloween party to be 
given by the Home Economics 
club next Friday evening. 

"Vacation Highlights" was the 
theme of the program. featuring 
Isabel Burros, who related exper-
iences In Jane Adams settlement 
house of Chicago; Miss Martye 
Poindexter, who told of her trip to 

a summer cabin tut Cum.-ads; Gem -- 
gia Reeves, who described her 
summr spent at Duke university 

in Dur
e
ham, N.C., and Marthella 

Clwns. who gave a description of 
sights in San Francisco. 

The Administrative cour 
approved a Matador ti 

Matador Band Will Show 
Marching Skill At Game 

The Matador band will begin 

their between-halves performance 

Saturday night by splitting into 

two platoons at the end of the 

field, giving a fanfare, and step- 

ping onto the field ?laying "Men 
of Ohio." Precision marching with 

countermarches, left and right 

columns, and several other drill 

movements will be the main part 

of the show. The conclusion will be 

the traditional playing of the Ma- 
tador song and forming of the 
Double T. 

College Calendar 

la, Chapaccit, dinner dance. Hil- 
ton hotel. S-12 p rn. 

t 1ep rally. gym, 7'15 p 
Freshman Ho., society HEI21, 

5 p.m. 
Alpha Psi Omega pledging. 24138 

Broadway, 7,30 p.m. 
Junior class meeting, C101, 5 p.m. 

Saturday. Oct. 21 
Tech vs. Southwestern U., Tech 

stadium. 8:15 p.m. 
Sunday, Ont. 22 

Sigma Tau Delta initiation. 2712 
Twenty-first. 4 p.m. 

Monday, Oct. 23 
Tau Beta Sigma. Ad210, 8 p.m. 
Newman club. Parish house. 7.30 

p.m. 
WICC, Ad220, 5 p.m. 
AIEE, E152, 7:30 p.m. 

Tuesday. Oct. 24 
Debate club, Ad202, 7:15 p.m. 
Kappa Kappa Psi. non. 7 p.m. 
Caps y Espada. Ad 220. 7,15 p.m. 
Phi U. He102, 7,30 p.m. 
Textile Engineering society. T101, 

7,30 p,m. 
Wednesday. Oct. 25 

Presbyterian group, Ad208, 5 p.m. 
WRA dancing. gym, 7:15 	 - 
Wranglers. Ad43,.._7_ ituces"7 

Critical Evaluations Give First Class 
Rating To La Ventant And Toreador 

FIRST class honor rating was accorded both La Ventana and 
the Toreador for the 1943-44 school year. The annual was 

judged by the All-American Year Book critical service and the 
paper was evaluated by the Associated Collegiate press. 

Winning first rating over a second class evaluation for 1943, 
last year's La Ventana was judged 
along with a group of annuals 
representing other colleges. The 
books were classified according to 
the enrollment of the schools from 
which they came. 

Staff for the 1943 edition of La 
Ventana consisted of Eleanor Cot-
ton, editor. Virginia Forbes, bust 
Nineisns„.m:usnLgie.rt  aLclitorEllen Helen 0 

analyze 	
used a score book to 

analyze college newspapers. Publi West Texas Association 

To Meet Friday Evening 
In Agriculture Building 

funds were lost. She landed near 
Vera Cruz and was sold Into slay- 	Between $1,200 and 51,500 was 
cry to a high government official's collected from the faculty and eta-  
wife. The beautiful gowns the pm, dent body in the Tech drive for 
teas owned created a sensation. the Lubbock County National War 
and, as a result. the national cos- fund, Dr. J. W. Davis, chairman 
tome grew out of the princess' of the drive, stated today. The 
wardrobe. Tech drive was very successful. 

The second case contains hua- and appreciation is extended to all 
raches of all types, an adze, a of the student and faculty assis-
machete of hand-hammered steel, tants, he said. Anyone missed by 
and a scabbard from Huasteca. the drive may leave contributions 
Several hells, head straps and with Dr. Davis, room 304, Admin-
sashes which are used to pull the istration building. 
burdens a Mexican woman car- The student drive for the Lub-
ries on her head or pulls after her, bock County National War fund 
and awornan's purse made from started Tuesday under direction of 
maguey fiber  are  shown. A pep- Maxine Craddock, president of the 
per grinder, fans woven of bright- student body. and ended Saturday. 
colored straw and used to fan The Lubbock County War fund 
charcoal fires, numerous wooden quota was $50,500, but no sepucete 
spoons, and some Toltec fertility quota was given Tech. 
goddesses from the pyramids of 
Teotihuacan also number among 

the items. 

The lust case contains hand-

made baskets, painted gourd bowls. 

thumbnail lacquered trays where 

Holds Full-Time Pastorate 
Tech Student, Ordained At 15, 

OPA Officer 
Speaks Today 

"Price Control through the Re-
conversion Period" will be discus-
sed by Mrs. Philip L. Crowlie, OPA 
representative, this afternoon at 4 
o'clock in Home Economics build-
ing, annex G. The lecture Is open 
to students in all divisions. 

During 1943, at the request of 
Prentiss Brown, Mrs. Crowlie was 
representative of the Homemakers 
of America in the Office of Price 
Administration, Washington, D.C. 
Conveying the reaction of homema-
kers to those drawing up regula-
tions affecting' consumers and In-
terpreting regulations to house-
wives were her duties in the OPA. 

She is now community service of-
ficer in the Department of Infor-
mation, Office of Price Administra-
tion, Washington, D.C. 

Mrs. Crowlie. former homemaker 
in South Dakota. was graduated 
from Eastern Normal Teachers 
college and attended the Univer-
sity of South Dakota. She has been 
affiliated with Red Cross activities, 
Parent-Teacher association, and 
National foundation for Infantile 
Paralysis, She also has hen. -1,', 
man of a committee for food con-
servation and mobilization of wo- 

Las Chaparritas, Ko Sharis 
Lead In Number of Beauties 

THIRTY-TWO beauties were chosen in La Ventana elimina- 
tion contest held in the P ass building Sunday afternoon. 

Candidates were selected by preferential voting. Sixteen of the 
thirty-two will be chosen in a s udent body election from 8 a.m. 
to 5 p.m. in Administration building Tuesday. 

Of the social clubs. Las Chapar-
rites had the greatest number of 
members and pledges selected. 
They are Ruth Anthony. Lubbock' 
Hope Cad, Sundown: Frances 
Clon in ger and Ma rilly n Gibson, 
Vernon: Fiances King, Coleman: 
LaJuana Leibfried, Floy dada; 
Gloria Nall. Big Spring; Corinin• 
Payne. Lubbock; Helen Pember-
ton, Seagraves; and Earlyne Reid, 
Coahorna. 

Ranking second, Ito Shari is 
represented by Virginia Anthony, 
Rails; Dorothy Brown, Lubbock; 
Margie Holmes, Randolph field: 
BeSerly Montague, Fort Worth: 
Elizabeth Robinson. Spade; Pat 
Smith, Amarillo; and Norma Lee 
Thornton, Hamilton. 

Las Vivarachas and DFD each 
had five pledges or members 
chosen. Las Vivarachas representa-
tives are Lucille Burns, Houston: 
Charlene Fizhel, Slaton, Martha 
Larche, Stamford: Mary Maloney, 
Seminole; and Celestine Wheeler, 
Tulia. 

Estelle DeBusk of Maim, Chris-
tina Eller of Lubbock, Betti Jordan 
of Plainview, Jerry Shaw of Phil-
lips and Jackie Wilkison of Friona, 
constitute the group of DFDs 
selected. 

San Soucis selected are Dolores 
Bizzell, Mary Ann May, and Patsy 
Pasiey, all of Lubbock. 

Lometa Hodge, Paducah, and 
Huguette McKnight, Fluvanna, are 
the only two independents in the 
group. 

Participating in judging the 164 
nominees were Charles Senning, 
senior president: Troy Caldwell, 
junior nresident2_ Tsd  

sophomore class representative; 
Dale Kenneth freshman vice 
president: Billy Johnson, College 
Club representative; Hugh Monroe. 
Wrangler representative, W. B 
Blankenship. Socii club representa-
tive: Jimmy Witt, Centaur repre-
sentative; Pat Blount, an indepen-
dent; Hugh Rowland, representing 
the fnotball boys: and Bob Boyd, 
dormitory representative. R. I 
Sinithers and Red lThite served 
as alternates. 

Ho . 7  P.m. 
Las Chaparritas, Ad 207. 7 p.m. 
Las Vivarachas, Ad320. 7 p.m. 
Sans Souci. Ad204. 7:15 p.m. 

Thursday. Oct. '26 
Progress reports in all freshman 

class, duo in registrar's office,
5 p.m. 

muncil. L25. 7 p.m. 
Ac1207, 0 p.111. 

Amarillo for the C' 	 . Ad220. 5 p.m. 
Tech bootball 	 of Commerce. 
Prof. D. 0. Wit' 
tween 90 ancallEMIIIMMIMikanor Steber. Lab- 
make the tile 	 awl , 8 p.m. 

Thirty Two 
Publications Place 
High In Contest 
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CHRISTIES 
1000 Broadway 

TECH BARBER SHOP 

"A Good Place to Trade" 

1103 COLLEGE 

It's Different .. . . 

NEAL'S 
EL PATIO 

• Mexican Food 
• Sea Food 
• Steaks 
• Fried Chicken 
• Short Orders 

Basement 
1011 Main 

From.... I 

2 ....Another 
By COUNT MEOUT 

We wonder what JO WHEAT 
and BILL BURTON have in com- 
mon? Could it be their mutual in- 
terest in pastels? 

ANGIE KVETON had a talkfest 
via telephone with LIEUT. DEL- 
BERT RAYBURN Friday evening. 
Recently returned from England, 
he will visit Tech campus soon. 

MARGARETTE LEGGITT is 
soon to wed A/S OTTO K. HAR- 
DEN, now stationed at Kingman,
Ariz. He was a preflight here last 
spring. 

Former Techsan CECIL JOE 
BURTON visited his sister. JANE, 
and brother, BILL, Friday. He re- 
cently returned from Saipan on a 
30-day furlough. 

We wonder how CHARLES 
HUEY likes being stood up? Es- 
pecially if he is waiting down in 
the lounge. 

DORIS HAMMERSCHMIDT 10 
sporting a chunk of ice on the 
third finger, left hand. 

That wreath of smiles on EVE- 
LYN HODGES' face is all because 
the boy friend is coming this week. 

The two yery likable slimes, 
JAMES COOK and M. .1. FOER- 
STER, were recently seen on the 
avenue having a hilarious time, as 
only two freshmen can. 

Regular visitors every Sunday 
night at The Jim are NOBLE RO- 
BERTS and DAVID BUCKING- 
HAM. Wonder what the attrac- 
tion could be. 

ROB KEY declares she dislikes 
Sunday afternoon dates because 
they last too long. One in a million, 
we say. 

Nomination for one of the friend- 
liest slimes on the campus, RAY 
IRWIN. 

SARA LOVE watches the mail 
quite anxiously-could it be that 
she has decided a certain lieuten- 
ant was so interesting a little too 
late? 

JIMMY DAVIS is exceptionally 
proud of the new color of his hair. 
Did we say brunette? Just take a 
look, kids. 

UMPY ROBINSON has lost a 

valuable picture. Will somebody 

please return it? 

JOE JIMMY KEAHEY does an 
exotic hula-hula say those who 
know. 

Lieut. and Mrs. EDISON OWEN 
are very proud of a new daughter, 
Carolyn. Mommy is former Tech- 
...CI-VELLA HEATH. 

vent any further occurrences of 
this type. We are sure that the 
boys involved did not stop to 
think how their action gave the 
police, college and student body a 
bad name. We are sorry that it 
happened. 

Thomas & Key Watch Repair 

1301 College 
	

oi 	I-9181 

Watch 

Repairing 

GUARANTEED 

QUICK SERVICE 

classes of the student body, especially freshmen, were there to 
encourage the players with songs and yells. 

A larger than usual percentage of the enthusiasts were 
girls, thanks to the freshmen boys, who were so thorough about 
making noise earlier outside the women's dormitories. Still, 
it is a fact that although there are twice as many women as men 
going to school, there are about twice as many men as women 
at the pep rallies. 

We congratulate all those who attended the early session 
on finding such a practical way of showing their school spirit. 
Speaking for the football boys, Tex Wallis says, "We are grate- 
ful for the big turnout at rallies. It makes us feel more like 
playing football." 

Billy Johnson, head cheer leader, has this to add, "The pep 
rally Friday morning was one of the best held here in the last 
five years. If only the same proportion would come to those 
held at night, the gym woulud be 'jammed.' I believe our sleep- 
ing school spirit has finally been awakened and will stay awake." 

Especially now, when the Raiders are having a hard season, 
they need to feel that the student body is behind them. If we 
encourage our team and show our loyalty by attending pep 
rallies and yelling for them at games, they will appreciate it 
much more than being patted on the back after they have 
won.—K. P. 

To The 
I'M sorry, but I just couldn't get here on time. Professor Z 

didn't dismiss my 8 o'clock class until on the hour." 
Many excuses of this nature are given every day by stu- 

dents who get to class later than five minutes after the hour 
because they were not dismissed from their previous class five 
minutes before the hour. Can the teacher justly blame the stu- 
dent for this kind of an alibi? Since the establishment of Tech, 
this five-minute rule has existed. That much interval is essential 
for students to go from one building to another—for instance, 
from the Administration building to the gym. 

Campus beautification has long been advocated and is now 
being put into practice. One of the specific requirements neces- 
sary for this plan to be realfzed is for students to walk on the 
sidewalks, even if they do have to go a little out of their way. 
To do this, ample time must be provided. If a student is dis- 
missed from class later than he should be, naturally the tend- 
ency is for him to cut across the closest way to his next class. 

The faculty members give one worn-out excuse for this 
carelessness on their part—the clocks are not together. Certainly, 
they're not. For nineteen years they haven't been. Most every 
professor owns a watch or clock, so why not use it? No at- 
tention should be paid to clocks on the campus. They never 
have been together ,and very likely never will be. If teachers 
get so involved in their classes they forget to look at their 
watches, then a practical suggestion would be to take an alarm 
clock to class and let it go off at five till the hour. 

Professors do not like for members of the next class to 
come into the classroom in the five minutes allotted for con- 
ferences before the hour is up. Students should not do this be- 
cause it does cause an unwarranted amount of confusion and 
disturbance. If however, the teacher neglects to dismiss the 
class until there is not sufficient time for these five-minute 
conference periods and he has to run over into the next hour, 
then the students cannot be blamed if they burst in upon him. 

Dormitory students do not eat breakfast until 7:30. If one 
is lucky, he can get through the long line and finish breakfast 
in twenty minutes, then he must complete his preparations for 
school, and at the very earliest he can be in the class room ready 
to begin work at five after eight. Students living in town have 
to ride busses—sometimes half way across the city. These 
busses do not always arrive early enough for the students to get 

- e•-•laas_before the correct time to start. 
Tech stiments-will be only too glad to cooperate with 

teachers if the latter will show D -Tirtiv-vrrore williragnoss to con - 

 sider the fairness and justice of this problem. 

keep Zip Thai 
SEVEN o'clock was not 

enthusiastic Teel, 
morning before the 
game. 

Member' 

c a large number of 
pep rally Friday 
^ulsa university 

ibs, and all 
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stye The 
WITHIN the past two weeks several acres of campus grass 

have been moved, sidewalks laid, grounds leveled off and 
trees trimmed. These changes have been made through the use 
of city funds donated by interested citizens of Lubbock. 

Working from another angle, the Campus Beautification 
committee, appointed two years ago to supervise the use of 
student funds in grounds' improvement, expects to meet next 
week to discuss further beautification plans for the year. The 
committee now has at its disposal $1,148. For the last several 
years, with the exception of this term, each student has donated 
50 cents of his breakage deposit to the beautification fund which 
is to be executed as the committee sees fit. Nine-tenths of the 
students giving the 50 cents did not miss that small amount. 
In most cases, they were glad to be instrumental in helping 
Tech, and it was easier to give the money than to go to the 
trouble of begging off. With improvements actually being made, 
would it not be well to continue these donations fOr the beauti-
fication of the campus? 

It is not entirely money from the two funds that has made 
our progress possible, however. George Long, superintendent 
of grounds, and his assistants are doing a splendid job despite 
the shortage of help and equipment. Filling up foot paths and 
running concrete, these men have been constantly on duty. The 
general improvement of the campus gives everyone's spirit 
a lift. 

Both students and faculty members have improved in their 
efforts to stay on sidewalks. Recently not nearly so many have 

taken the well-established trails winding over the campus. It 
has come to our attention, however, that it has been mainly the 
girls who have "blazed the trails," and that the boys have ex-
ceeded them in conforming to the wishes of those in charge of 
the construction. In lieu of this fact, one point to be considered 

tIzat-theFo-Are sidewalks leading from-the boys dormitories 
to their main centers of activity, while the girls must, if they 
stay on the walks, go half way around the circle to get to the 
Library or Press building. 

The campus as a whole is improving, both students and 
faculty are trying to stay on the walks, and the grounds superin-
tendent is working to make Tech a more beautiful institution. 
Taking all of these things into consideration, however, there 
must be more improvements made, more funds donated and 
fewer students and faculty members taking out across our 320 
acres that is designa!ted as "actual campus" before all the pos-
sibilities of beauty are utilized for Tech. 

Eleanor Steber 
Soprano 

Metropolitan Opera Association 

Auspices: Tech Artists Course 

Lubbock High School Auditorium 

Thursday, October 26, 

at 8 p.m. 

Tickets: $1.25 (students only), $1.50 plus federal tax 

On sale: B. E. Adair Music Co., 1012 Main 

.student tickets when presented by other than the original purchaser will be taken 
up at the door.) 
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THE following article, which appeared in the local paper last 
week, has excited much comment both on and off the 

campus. For the benefit of those who did not read it, we will 
reprint it and try to give a mote complete account of the in- 
cident. The article appeared as follows: 

"Fun is fun; boys will be b ys, 
etc.; youthful exuberance will out, 
and all that sort of thing. But 
When fun degenerates into vandal- 
ism, that's something else. 

"Herewith is a factual report on 
an occurrence here last Saturday 
night a few minutes before the 
opening of the Tech-Oklahoma 
Aggle football game. Facts con- 
tained here-in some from the 
source; The Plainsman personally 
can vouch that the couple involved 
are citizens of veracity and of high 
standing in their nearby farm com- 
munity where they are well known. 
We are not using their names be- 
cause they fear miscreants in- 
volved might try to get even by 
another attack. 

"A citizen and members of his 
family, including his wife, were no 
route to the football game. They 
were driving south along College 
avenue. The Tech stadium was to 
their immediate right. 

"Ahead of them they saw a 
crowd of boys estimated at from 
40 to 50 in number whom they first 
thought were parading. When they 
discovered the boys were not par- 
ading, they proceeded slowly along 
the avenue-which was their right 
-in en effort to procged. The boys 
had the street blocked. The citizen 
brought his car to a near stop, try- 
ing to thread his way through the 
boys blocking the way. 

"The boys-many of them wear- 
ing freshman caps and described 
as Tech students-literally swarm- 
ed on the car, which The Plains- 
man Inspected after the occur- 
rence. 

"They kicked dents in the side 
of the car and in the fenders. One 
shattered the front window on the 
left side. The driver, fearing to get 
out and remonstrate with them for 
fear he'd be met with mob violence, 
got through as best he could. 

"Further down the street the 
man saw two policemen. Neither 
he nor his wife can say whether 
they were city policemen or high- 
way patrolmen. Anyhow, they told 
the officers of the occurrence. 

"You don't expect as to do any- 
thing about it. do you, when Tech 
college won't?" was the reply the 
couple say they received from one 
of the officers. 

"That sounds bad from two 
angles. 

"It's bad that the police-wheth- 
er state or city-take that attitude 
toward vandalism. It's an un- 
pleasant indictment of Tech au- 
thorities. 

"Of course, this Is an isolated 
occurrence. 

"It probably will not happen 

again-at least we Hope It won't. 

"But it occurs to on that the 
great majority of Tech students, 
who are good, clean, honest Ameri- 
can kids and who do not counten- 
ance such goings-on; the authori- 
ties of the college, and the police 
should make sure it doesn't hap- 
pen again. 

That sort of thing, while per- 
petrated by only a very few, gives 
the w"nle collect. and student body 
a bad name. That angle. in itself, 
makes it all the more essential 
that vandalism be stopped before 
it gets well started." 

In reply to "the factual report" 
given in the above article, we, the 
students of Texas Tech, would like 
to assure The Plainsman that we 
have no plans to "get even by an- 
other attack." If the couple, whose  

names are withheld, would like to 
attend another game here, we are 
sure that they will not be met with 
mob violence. 

As a result of some investigation 
we have found that facts contained 
in this article do not exactly give 
a true picture of the episode. First 
of all the crowd of boys was slight- 
ly underestimated. There were be-
tween 250 and 300 freshmen parad- 
ing at the time of "the attack. 
That is, they were parading if we 
are permitted to call our tradition- 
al snake dance that. 

We do not deny the right of the 
couple to "proceed slowly along 
the avenue." Doubtless we were In 
the wrong to holding up traffic for 
a few minutes, but we would like 
to give the eye witness account of 
six boys who saw "the attack." 
According to these students, whose 
names will be furnished upon re- 
quest. the couple drove up to boys, 
who had the street blocked, and 
tried to edge their way through 
the line. When the boys refused to 
break the line, the driver put the 
car in reverse and backed up about 
half a block. Instead of turning off 
on a side street as he could have 
done to avoid the crowd, he then 
put the car in first and started 
toward the boys, who had to break 
the line to avoid being run over. 
About six or eight boys jumped on 
the fenders to keep from being hit, 
and one in anger broke the front 
window. 

Afterward the man saw two 
policeman, whom after a little 
questioning we found we high- 
way patrolmen. However, 

er 
 their re- 

ply to the couple was not correct 
es recorded by The Plainsman. 
According to Capt. N. R. Smith, 
of the state highway patrol, the 
couple approached two of his 
patrolmen and asked what they 
could do about a boy breaking out 
the window glass of their car. 
When asked who the boy was, they 
replied that he was one of the Tech 
freshmen, but they did not know 
him and wouldn't be able to identi- 
fy him. The patrolmen explained 
that there wasnit much they could 
do If the people couldn't identify 
him. They suggested that the 
couple report the accident to the 
college authorities who might be 
able to find out who broke the 
window. 

The only damage reported was 
the broken glass. No mention was 
made to the patrolmen about the 
car being practically demolished 
as the Plainsman reported. So for 
nothing of the attack has been re- 
ported to the proper college 
authorities. 

We are not trying to defend the 
boys who damaged the car, but we 
did want to present a true account 
of the incident. True, Tech students 
should have learned from the 
cradle not to destroy other peoples' 
property, but any newspaper man 
should know to investigate a•story 
and not accept one angle as "the 
source." 

We do not deny the fact that 

the boys concerned were unjusti- 

fied in their display of anger. The 

action of these few has reflected 
on the entire student body. Steps 
are now being taken "to see that 
it doesn't happen again." The 
Saddle Tramps are malting plans 
to patrol the avenue for 30 minutes 
before each game. This will help 
solve the traffic problem and 'pre- 

4 Teclisan S 
By Betty Ricks 
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Students - 

Let us fix the watch that won't run. Bring it in and 

let our expert 

FIVE DAY WATCH REPAIRING 

take care of it. 

Look over our stocks of diamonds, 

costume jewelry and watches. Make 

your choices from these selections. 

PEACOCK'S 
Jewelry 

On the Avenue 1107 College 

   

considerate themselves of the box-
holders down front. If you want to 
rush onto the field the minute the 
final gun sounds, then go down to 
the end zone gate and enter there; 
don't go jumping across the boxes 
and stepping on ladies hats. Those 
boxholders payed for the right to 
sit there, and they don't deserve to 
be mobbed the minute the game is 

over. 
Many students are wondering 

what has happened to the colorful 

Dr. Bohm Becomes Editor 
Of Conference Newsletter 

Dr. A J. Barbra professor of 
philosophy and sociology and secre-
tary-treasurer of the Southwestern 
Philosophical conference, is editor 
of the conference Newsletter. The 
November number of the publica-
tion Is being sent  to members this 
week. 

   

Students- 

The TECH CAFE 

  

Welcomes You And Your Friends 

 

• Popular Prices 

• Good Food 

  

12115 Brdwj. 
	 Phone 2-3621 

 

   

   

Hilton Hotel Bldg. 

O h rysantheMUMS 

were made for 

football games 

Let us send her 
favorite color for 
the game 

riCBLE 'S 

Phone 5744 

Varsity Bookstore 

Friday, October 20, 1944 

         

    

THE TOREADOR 

 

Page Three 

          

          

Raiders Clash With Southwestern Pirates Tomorrow 

ly the entire 1942 Texas university 
football team, along with sundry 
gridiron gentry from Texas Chris-
tian. Baylor and lesser colleges. 
This conglomeration of brilliance, 
shunted to the tiny Georgetown 
campus by Marine and Naval train-
ing, began the season by walloping 
Texas university and played out 
the season with only one loss—
that to Southern Louisiana Insti-
tute- to end up In the Sun Bowl, 
where under-rated New Mexico 
managed to eke out a tie. 

This year, the story doesn't read 
so glamorously but things are still 
joke with Medley, compared to 
peacetime hardships of coaching at 
Southwestern. Harold Fische r, 
picked on at least one All-Ameri- 

a nightmare before succumbing. 
And three wins to the Pirates' 
credit Include victories over Gal-
veston Army Air field. 59 to 0, 
Louisiana Tech, 20 to 0, and North 
Texas Agricultural college. 39 to 6. 

Southwestern's returning letter-
men include: End Morris Bratton, 
180-pounder from Cleburne and a 
junior: Tackle Ed McFarland, 220-
pound junior from Lufkin; Tackle 
George Biomquist, 194-pound soph-
omore from Florence: Joe Baum-
gardner, 170-pound sophom o r e 
wingback from Austin: Quarter-
back Dale Giles, 185-pound junior 
from Corpus Christi; Ed Braswell, 
165-pound wingback from San 
Antonio. 

In addition, there's flashy Don 
Hughes, 165-pound triple-threater 
from Lufkin who is the spark of 
the Pirate backfield. 

So this is the outfit the Red 
Raiders must tackle Saturday 
night in their fifth attempt this 
season to ring the Victory Bells. 

"Winless wonders." though they 
be to date, the Raiders have three 
merits which can be hozannaed to 
the firmament and which make for 
optimism on the eve of Game Five. 

In their first four games with-
out victory, the Men-In-Red: 

1. Never stopped trying. 
2 Never failed to score. 
3. Never failed to Improve or 

much they looked like a different 
team each succeeding weekend. 

In Tulsa last Staurday night, 
the Oil City's great bowl-bound 
aggregation held a slim lead ant 
its heart in its [bloat going into 
the final period, with an sh-,t 
Tech 11 making it look very much 
like anybody's ball game. 

Only a terrific running and pass-
ing attack with all stops out en- 
abled Tulsa to storm up and down 
the field for three touchdowns in 

the final frame. to give the Hurd- 

Four-Time Losers Yp 

Raider uniform we have been ,oe 

customed to seeing up to this yen. 
The answer Is that they were d,- 

hoyed in the fire at the stadil,. 
dugout last spring. New red jel 
seys were ordered at the beginnae 
of the season and after several de 
lays have finally arrived. However. 
since it is the custom of the horn , 

 team to let the visitors wear thec 
favorite color, it Is doubtful if e• 
will see much of the Raiders in 

the traditional red. The red PI 

says will be worn when the Raid, - 

are on the road and at all hen, 
games wherein the visitors weal 
color other than red. 

Don Grote. I 

Grove Is Tech's 
Towering Tackle 

Imagine .. 
big enough to louno• 

on his knee 1prov1,13.1.: 
man isn't Primo 	r 

youngster who is merel: 

second year of college and 

ready played out a season • 

lege football. 
That's Don Grove, pride of Moo 

ment. N. M., whose stn lure 

somewhat monumental itself in 

tackle position in the Red Rauh 
line. 

Donsoars up to a belch ,  

(See GROVES page C 

Hope For Victory 

T/te 

Sideiute - - 
It, Hugh Itoo.lanol 

1:1 	  

This weekend the Raideis face an 
almost certain fifth defeat in the 
shape of the Southwestern Pirates. 
But, if the "Morgan Men" keep im-
proving at the rate they have been 
the mighty Pirates may hr the vic-
tims of a terrific. upset. 

The Pirates swing Into the 
Raiders Saturday night with all 
men up and playing. Hughes, their 
crippled star back, Is again on the 
field, and will meet the Raiders 
in top notch condition. Although 
the season has left Medley's start-
ing 11 intact this far, the 

"Burrs" will face the mental hazard 
of having to undergo a final ex- 
amination this week before the end 
of the semester, with convocation 
Friday morning. This brings sharp-
ly to the recollection of Southwes-
tern fans the only defeat of last 
season, when the Pirates had com-
pleted finals Saturday morning be-
fore meeting Southern Louisana 
institute in Houston that night. 
The only other advantage the 
Raiders will hold is that they will 
meet the Pirates here on the Ma-
tadors' own stomping ground and 
the Pirates will be unaccustomed 
to this altitude. 

The Pirates have seven Toys of 
last year's team playing again this 
year. They have nine men with one 
year of college experience and ten 
men with two years to their credit. 
With the Naval and Marine units 
supplying most of their players, 
some of whom are tough over-seas 

veterans, the Pirates stack up for 
more experience than our Raiders. 
Baumgardner. their marine star. 

has played one year for Texas U 
and has started his second season 
with the Pirates. Griffin, star de-
fensive blocking back, has two 
years experience from Texas A&M, 
and Bratton. "big dog" of last year, 
has two years of college football 
behind him Thy Pirates' starting 

lineup averages 194 pounds as 
compared to our 183. Our scout re-
port shows the Pirates have a very 
tough team with fast hacks and 
big line. 

With comment flying thick and 
fast as to incidents of our last 
home game, a situation has arisen 
which needs the cooperation of 
Tech students. A lot of local yo- 
kels and other varied characters 
are in the habit of invading the 
east football stand, running up and 

down the aisle, stumbling over the 

box seats and otherwise creating 

Griffin an undesirable commotion. Tech 

Hughes students have been asked to help 
Baumgardner keep "objectional foreigners" out 

McDonald of the student section arm to be 

11111=1111111111 1111111111111111I 

SENIORS 
Come In And See For Yourself The 

RED RUBY STONES 

Tech indeed stands a good 
chance to lambast Southwestern. 
as would any football team which 
could make a ball game of It for 
three quarters with top-notcher 
Tulsa university before being over-
whelmed by waves of fresh re- 
serves, as did the Raiders last 
weekend in losing to the Golden 
Hurricane 34 to 7 

Southwesternin normal times 
would not even rate a "breather" 
spot on the Tech schedule, but this 
is war, brother. 

Last year Cinderella Man Med- 
ley found himself in somewhat 	The alert Raider backs stifled 

selfconscious possession of virtual- Tulsa in the first half by inter- 
cepting two passes deep in their 
own territory and pouncing on two 
vital fumbles to turn the tide when 
the heat was on 

This was the third consecutive 
victory (dr Tulsa coach Henry 
Frnka, former Lubbock high school 
mentor. over his former school-
mate and bosom pal, Dell Morgan, 
in a rivalry between Tech and 
Tulsa that started in the 1942 Sun 
Bowl game. The 34-7 score was 
exactly the same score by which 
Tulsa defeated Tech last year. 

The 20 to 3 advantage in first 
downs held by Tulsa accentuates 
the difference In the two teams, 
which makes It all the more re• 
Intuitable that the Raiders could 

keep the crowd of 8,500 people 

can team at guard, and Jack poised on the edges of their seats 
Sachse are co-captains at their old 

wondering what was going to hap 
alma mater, Texas university this 
year, and the other stars have pen next. Because for most of the 

shrugged aside football for sea game, it wasn't the walkaway the 
and garrison duty, but six of the score indicates, and Tulsa's first 

mighty crew remain. along with 
numerous hot freshman prospects 
and some more of those Naval 
trainees. 

In any case, Medley has no rea- 

son to groan. The Pirates lost to 

• Ilissaa 20-0 and Southern Methodist 

16-15, but outplayed SMU all the 

way and gave Texas something of 

THE Cinderella Man of Texas college football—Head Coach 
R. M. Medley of Southwestern university—brings his potent 

Pirates here for a tussle Saturday night with Texas Tech's oft- 
defeated Red Raiders, who may themselves finish out the season 
riding in a pumpkin coach if Dell Morgan's magic wand 'con- 
tinues to work wonders in improv ' ca 	  
M cane a top-heavy 	over the Techsans. 

'Icing Techsans. 
Fast-stepping veteran Maurice 

"Red" Wade, former all-Big Six 
star at Missouri university. scamp-
ered through the Redmen to lead 
the Tulsa assault. 

Tulsa scored first In the initial 
period and again In the third 
stanza to take a 14-0 lead, but Tech 
struck suddenly and effectively 
through the air fora third quarter 
score that made it 14-7. A 27-yard 
pass from Gene Hardey to Luke 
Thompson was the scoring thrust 
for Tech. 

string did all the scoring. 
The game tomorrow night in 

the first meeting between Texas 
Tech and Southwestern.  

Tech In coming back strong. 
That's why the Raiders nape 

to sink the Pirates and toll mid-

night for the Cinderella Man.  
Probable starting lineups: 

Texas Tech 	 Southwestern 
Thompson 	LE 	 Bare 
Snodgrass 	LT 	 Latch 
Birdwell 	LG 	McFarland 
Turner 	 C 	 George 
Lawson 	 RC; 	Blondanski 

Frazee 	 RT 	Blumqulst 
Taylor 	 RE 	Bratton 
Hardey 	 QB 
Shahan 	 LH 
Norris 	 RH 
Schlinkman 	FB 

For your Senior rings. Only the clear brilliance of a RUBY can make the beautiful ring you are entitled 
to as a TECH SENIOR. 

1305 College Avenue 
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Four members of the home PC0-  

nomles faculty met with Junior 

League and representatives of the 

Federation of Women's Cams Mon-
day afternoon to discuss possible 
rid for the Negro nursery school 
in Lubbock. This school. establish-
ed and supervised by Negro wo-
men, is composed primarily of 
children whose mothers are em-
ployed. 

Tech faculty members who at-
tended were Dean Margaret W. 
Week, dean of the home economics 
division; Miss Sannie Callan, head 
of the department of family rela-
tions and child development; Miss 
Bernice Borgman, assistant pro-
fessor of family relations and child 
development; Miss Vivian Johnson. 
head of the department of home 
economics education; and Miss 
Doris Nesbitt. assistant professor 
of home economics education. 

Cogdill Named Editor For 
Kappa Kappa Psi Publication 

Kappa Kappa Psi, national hon- 
orary band fraternity. are starting 
a band paper this week, "The 
Coda." Jackie Cogdill was elected 
editor and his staff Includes John 
Ewing, Charles Sanders and Robert 
McNabb. 

—Keep On The Sidewalks— 

CLEANING AND LAUNDRY 

• Quickest Service 
• Cheapest Service 
• Best Work 

MORRIS PICK-UP 
STATION 

1303 College 	 Dial 2-1222 

eL alabitficant and mewled 
Salularama of Amerman faraLly 
and taudneas Ide packed le.  
drama and romance,a 

Your opportunity 
to own a copy of 

MARCIA DAVENPORT'S 

THE VALLEY 
OF DECISION 
One of the truly great novels of 
our time. More than 200,000 
co7les have been sold at $3.00. 
Now, for a limited time only, by 

special arrangement with the 
publisher and author, you can 
secure this magnificent panorama 
of American family life ovr a 
span of three generations at

e 
 the 

low price of 51.49. 

OTHER REPRINT EDITIONS 

OF RECENT NEW BOOKS 

Song of Bernadette, by 

Frans Werfel 	 $1.49 

A Tree Grows in Brooklyn 
by Betty Smith 	 $1.49 

Last Train from Berlin 
by Howard Smith 	$1.39 

COMPLETE AND 
UNABRIDGED 

Under Cover, by Carlson 
	

$1.49 

Basic History of the 
United States by Mary 
and Charles Beard 

	
690 

Stars on the Sea by 
Vab Wyck Mason 	$1.39 

TEXAS TECH COLLEGE 

BOOKSTORE 

"On the Campus" 

CAPTAIN CLENE 

SAYS — "Be patriotic! Keep your clothes 

In good condition by having them clean- 

ed and pressed regularly" 

VOGUE CLEANERS 
1209 College 	 Dial 2-2491 

Hemphill Elected 
To Head Exes 

Rev. Kenneth R. Hemphill has 

been elected president of the South 
Texas Tech Ex-Student Associa-

tion. This organization will include 

the territory south of Austin to 

the valley, west to San Angelo, 

and east to Columbus. The group 

haa_been  active in the promotion 

of the Tech-A&M football game, 

which has been held there the last 

two years, and which they hope 

will become an annual affair. 
Hemphill, pastor of the Trinity 

Methodist church in San Antonio, 
was a government major and grad-
uated from Tech in 1928, 

Vocational, agricultural and home 
economics teachers met with the 
Lubbock county Home Economics 
association Monday evening to dis-
cuss "Vocational Education Today 
and Tomorrow." Leaders were 0. 
T. Ryan, L. M Hargrave and Mrs. 
J. C. Bateman. 

Sideline- 
lContinued From Page Three 

feet and four inches. and he tips 
the scales at somewhere around 
210 pounds. depending on how 
many pounds of steak he had for 
dinner. 

Although not consistently in the 
Tech starting lineup. Dan usually 
gets in the game for a good many 
minutes. enough to make the op-
position think Dell Morgan is play-
ing two men at the same tackle 
spot. 

He entered Tech last year as a 
stripling of 18, and soon proved 
his value to the Raider grid squad 
This year he N more-or-less a griz-
zled 17-year-old veteran of the 
gridiron, as wartime football play-
ers go. Don wears jersey no 81, 
often observed tearing into rival 
backfields. 

Grove was an outstanding basket-
ball player of Tech last season 
also, his great height helping him 
o roll up points aplenty for the 
Raider cagers. He was one of the 
coring leaders for the Tech basket- 

Send Her 

A Mum 

r OP I 

PERRY'S 
Dial 6654 
	

1728 Broadway 
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HE Instructors 
Plan Aid For 
Negro Nursery 
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Chaps Dine And Dance Tonight_  ill  

THOMPSON 
BARBER SHOP 

I.ET US SERVE YOU 

1113 College 	Phone 2-1561 

Men's Honor Society 
Stresses Scholarship 

Sixteen students have been de-
clared eligible for Scroll and Key. 
men's freshman honor society. 
Membership is based on last 
spring's enrollment and the two 
summer sessions, according to 
Dean of Men James G. Allen, club 
sponsor. 

Scroll and Key was organized 
last spring, with nine charter mem-
bers, to encourage scholarship 
among freshmen students. By next 
spring the club plans to fulfill the 
requirements of Phi Eta Sigma, 
national freshman honor society, 
and to petition for a charter. 

Students who are eligible but 
have not been Initiated are 

Wesley L. Askew, jr.. Donald C. 
Duggan, Robert J. Fairchild. Ted 
H. Forsythe, Eugene Hardey, Bob 
P. Hassell. Bobby L. McFarland. 
Marion Manderson, Francis Miller, 
David Mohle, William Phillips, 
Charles W. Sanders, Charles E. 

Orvis Smith, James B. 
Spaulding and Jerry Win LeMond. 

A banquet will be given In honor 
of the new members later In the 
fall. 

Students who fulfilled the re-
quirements and were initiated last 
spring are now eligible to w d ear 
the dub charm, which is a sym- 
bolic scroll and key. They are: 

D. H. Brewster, John Ed Ewing. 
John Lewis Hickey. Fred William 
Knoll. Warren Meeks, William E. 
Murfee, Mickie Sweeney, Barton C. 
Willingham and Walter James 
Wanner. 

Present requirements for mem-
bership in the club are: 

1. That during the summer ses-
sion they were regularly enrolled 
students, now having less than 30 
hours credit. exclusive of credit In 
band and physical education. 

2. That during the summer ses-
sion they should have earned a 
minimum credit of 12semester 
hours, exclusive of credit In band 
and physical education. 

3 That if transfer students. 
they should not have transferred 
more than 20 credit hours to our 
college. 

4. And, on that 12 or more sem- 
ester hours for which they earned 
credit during the summer session, 
exclusive of credit in band and 
physical education (one hour 
courses). they shall have made a 
2.25 average. 

Any student who feels he has 
fulfilled the requirements for be-
coming a member of Scroll and 
Key may make application for 
membership at the office of Dean 
Allen. 

TECH DRUG 

STORE 

We'll be open after the game 

tomorrow night. Drop in and 

enjoy yourself. 

MR & MRS. E. L. STOVALL 

Owners 

1.101 College 	 Dial 2-1051 

Sigma Tau Delta 
To Pledge Seven. 

Psi Delta chapter of Sigma Tau 
Delta, rintaind honorary English 
-cadet will initiate new members 
Sunday rit 4 p.m. at 2712 Twenty-
first, according to Reta Norman, 
president. New members are Jane 
Gilmore. Moriorle Holmes, Ellen 
Artman, Anita Hale, La Vena 
Riley. Mrs. Louise B. Hair, and 
Marian Coolidge. 

Sponsors are Dr. W. B. Gates, 
Miss Lucille Gill, and Dr. Kathryn 
Huganir. 

Alpha Psi Omega Initiates 
Eight Pledges Tonight 

Pledge services will be held to-
night at 7:30 p.m. at 2413-B Broad-
way for Alpha Psi Omega. 

Louise Ince. Mary Findley, Jane 
Wilson. Kidy Cole. Maxine Hen-
nersdorf, Fay Beth Hill, Margie 
Holmes, and Earline Rodgers are 
the pledges. 

Alpha Psi Omega is a national 
dramatic fraternity for senior col- 
leges and requirements for mem- 
bership vary with the particular 
school. At Tech a person must be 
a member of Sock and Buskin, 
rncat certain performance require-
ments, and be voted on by active 
members of the chapter. 

Initiation services will be held 
within the next two weeks when 
pledges will become active mem-
bers of the fraternity. 

She was only a surgeon's daugh-
ter. but oh what a cut-up. 

—Keep On The Sidewalks 

The Women's Recreational as-

sociation volleyball tournament be-

gan Tuesday with seven teams 

participating. Each Tuesday from 

5 to 6 p.m. three series of games 

will be played 

The Coyotes drew a bye this 
week. Captain of the team is Mil-
dred Herring and players are 
Margaret Brockman. 011ie Mae 
Grizzle, Sue Thompson, Celia Pat-
terson, and Billie Jean Price. 

The Turtles, led by Captain Helen 
McDonald, wona series. two out 
of three, from the Rough and 
Readies. The defeated captain was 
Rath Griffin. Turtles are Jennie 
Pointer, Ruth Sanders, Betty Jane 
Jones. Doris Richardson. and 
Selma Keen. Losing team mem-
bers were Mildred Shook, Joyce 
Corley. Jane Knowles, Ruth Cald-
well and Tinny Lewis. 

Captain Louise Biffle's Ready 
and Waiting group took Captain 
Maxine Brown's Peppies for a loss. 
Winners were Veda Pierce. Jeanne 
Cowart. Sybil Booth. Benny Beav-
ers, and Wanda Walker. The de-
feated Peppies are Catherine 
Vaughn. Dorothy True, Wanda Sul-
livan, Joyce Carr, Frankie Cum-
mins, and Betty Ewing. 

The Wolverines, captained by 
Betty Jo Stevens, defeated the Slap 
Happy Sots of Betty Nance. The 
Wolverines are Polly Cook, Marie 
Moore, Juanita Foreman, Faye 
Harlan, and Posey Gaines. The 
Slap Happy Sots are Natalie Hale. 
Viola Dernel, Billie Aseue. Bert 
Sims, and Betty Jackson. 

Next Tuesday the Coyotes will 
play the Peppies. the Turtles will 
tackle the Wolverines and the 
Ready and Waiting team will play 
the Slap Happy Sots. The Rough 
and Ready drew a bye for next 
week series. 

Foreign Novels 
Now In Library 

Rico, Bandit and Dictator by W. 
Nordoff, which has been acclaimed 
an outstanding novel by the Libra-
ry Journal, is now on the library 
recreational shelf. This book is as 
colorful and romantic as its South 
American background. Another no-
vel in the South American setting 
is Wind on the Pampas by Betty 
De Sherbinin. Other novels with a 
foreign setting which will be dis-
played are Susses Gorse by Mar-
jorie Coryn, Three Cities by Sha-
lom Asch, Leaf in the Storm by 
Lin Yutang, and The Promise by 
Pearl Buck. 

Our Arabian ?Tights, by Ruth and 
Helen Hoffman, describes the so-
cial life and customs of Iraq and 
Bagdad. Other non-fiction books 
now available for two-week loan 
are Ambassadors in White; A 
Story of American Tropical Medi-
cine by Charles Wilson and Sub-
ject India by Henry Brailsford. 

For Wodehouse fans, The Indis-
cretions of Archie will be an at-
traction. Poetry lovers will find col-
orful, but very different, /Ps 'Ard 
to On Wrong in the Cactus, a col-
lection of Australian verses by Kay 
Grant. 

FOUND 

If you can Identify a Sheaffer 
Lifetime fountain pen or a brace-
let with name of "Peggy" en- 
graved on it that was recently 
found in the College hook_store, 
you ran have Nellie by describ-
ing It to W. C. Cole, manager of 
the bookstore. 

LAS Chaparritas club will entertain new pledges with a din- 
ner dance tonight from 8 to 12 At the Hilton hotel.  

Chrysanthemums and autumn leaves will be used as table 
decorations and Bailey Ireland's orchestra will furnish music . 

Members and their escorts are: 
Ruth Anthony, John White; Anna --- 

Baker, Lieut. Bill Bledsoe; Mary 
Frances Barnard. Roger Flanagan; 
Norma Barnes. Lieut. Ben Cow-
ling; Fairy Breeding, Fred Lee-
man; Donella Bucy, Lieut. Tom 
LeMond; Nancy Everline, P. L. 
Payne; Margie Gerber. Spider Dil-
lon. 

Edy Hill, Bill Barnett; LaJuana 
Leibfried, Stanley Cathcy; Ned 
McCleskey, Jack Waldrep7 Sarah 
McDonald, Richard Eichin g e r; 
Virginia Pitts, Johnny Harris; has returned after two years work 
Betty Summers. Ed Boaz; Billie with the War department. 
Grace Webb, Bill Kennedy; John- Dr. Eleanor B. Scott has assumed 
anna Williams, John Perry; Martha duties as instructor in freshman 
Wilson. Jack Smith: Erlyne Reid. English. Dr. Scott was added to 
Hoke Holbrook. the faculty because over three 

Pledges and dates are: Allene hundred more students have en-
Seville, Paul Payne: Betty Bomar, rolled for English courses this fall 
Oscar Allen; Nelda Butler, Gerald than did last semester, according 
Henderson; Hope Cade, Cpl. Joe to Dr. W. B. Gates, head professor. 
Nelson; Frances Cloninger, Orvis She formerly taught at Florida 
Smith; Jo Cobb, Lee Ray Swim; State College for Women and at 
Carlynn Cox. Woody Baker; Maxine Trinity university, San Antonio. 
Cozdens, Pfc. Tommy Culver. and received her doctorate from 

Ann Miley, Jack Cooper: Ka - the University of Wisconsin. 
mona Eagan. Bourdon Smith; Lynn O. C. Southall, instructor with 
Gibson. Lieut. Dan Prindle; Nelva the Army Specialized Training 
Joyce Halbert, Glenn Hillman: program on the campus for 21 
Billie Harp, Jimmy 'Witt; Bettie months has been admitted to the 
Hart. Jimmy Davis; Sue Hines. regular Tech faculty as an 
Lynn Gillespie;Gillespie; Dorothy Hlavaty, structor in chemistry. He was su- 
M. J. Forrester: Elizabeth Kelm, perintendent of the Slate's public 
Robert Guirette: Frances King, schools before coming to Tech. 
Billy Johnson; Kathryn Kirk- 	Richmond Bronaugh, formerly 
patrick. Bill Bell 	 connected with the Bureau of Eco- 

Martha Lively, Lewis Howard; nomic Geology at the University' 
Vera Herber Maas, Hardy Scott; of Texas. is a new instructor in 
Bonnie Jo Mapes. Fred Rogers: geology. 
Maye Mitchell, Paul Armstrong: 	Dr. Edgar Thomas Ruff. instruc- 
Gloria Nall, Scrappy Hodges; Edna for in French. 1941-42, has returned 
Earle Parker. Ted Ray: Corinne after two years of work in the 
Payne, Stanley Swenson; Jean War department. He received his 
Prince. Jackie Jernigan. BA and MA at Northwestern uni-

Pat Quinlan, George Wilson; versity and his PhD at the Unl-
June Royalty, Jack Casimer; versity of Texas. His return was 
Ethelbert Sims, Beak Stovall; effected by greatly increased en-
Norma Faye Skinner, Frank Fite; rollment in elementary French, it 
Dorotha Summers. Bob Burks; was announced in the foreign 
Jerry Taylor, Jimmy Williams; language office. 
Lois Jean Weekes, Richard Gib-
son: Earline Whitaker. A/C Jack 
Snide r. 

Other guests will be Mr. and 
Mrs. George E. Langford and Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Senning. 

Two new science instructors and 

one new English instructor have 

been added to the Tech faculty 

and a former French instructor 

Scott, Southall, 
Bronaugh Added 
To Tech Faculty 

16 Eli ible For 	Seven Teams Open 
WRA Volleyball 	Reunion Here g  

Scroll and Key 	Tourney Tuesday Four Ex-Techsans 
Of Latch Family 
To Meet At Game 

Bill Latch, former Red Raider 

who is starting left tackle on the 

Southwestern lineup here tomorrow 
night, will be honored with a family 
reunion which will include two 
sisters and a brother, all former 
Techsane. Latch is now a Marine 
candidate in officers' training at 
Southwestern university. George-
town. 

Pvt. Lela Latch, sister to Bill, 
is now a Link instructor at an air 
base in Kingman, Ariz. and will 
arrive here In time for the Tech-
Southwestern game. Private Latch. 
who taught school in Cisco for eight 
years. will be on her first furlough 
since noising the Air WAC in Jan-
uary '43. Prior to her transfer to 
Kingman this month, she was an 
instructor at Mather field. Sacra- 
mento, Calif. 

Mary Latch Latham, another 
sister. is now enrolled as a journal-
ism student. 

Leonard Latch, brother, was a 
Tech letterman of '38, '39 and men-
tioned for All-American in '39. is 
a geologist and Lubbock resident. 
The reunion will he at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Latch, 
2317 Seventh street. Mrs. Leonard 
Latch, formerly Bobbie Nelms. is 
also a Tech graduate. 

Before joining the Marine corps 
Bill Latch played on Tech's "frock" 
team of '40. His ship, the cruiser 
Helena. was among the first in 
action at Pearl Harbor. The Helena 
helped cover the first Marine land- 
ings on Guadalcanal and for 14 
months blazed her way to glory inn 
expendable combat for the Solo-
mons.4The cruiser Helena was sunk 
in her thirteenth engagemnet, after 
exacting a reprisal of four Jap 
ships in eight minutes of continu-
ous fire in the battle of Kula gulf 
on July 6. 1943. Bill, captain of a 
gun crew, was among the survivors 
later picked up from the water. 

Aggie club met Tuesday night to 
discuss their annual pig roast. 
which is to be held Tuesday even-
ing. Nov. 7. Jack Creel gave a re-
port on the food for the pig roast 
and D. H. Brewster reported on 
the coming Aggie volleyball 
tournament. Barton Willingham 
president. 

The group discussed buying a 
page in La Ventana, but a motion 
on this matter was held until the 
next meeting. 

After the business session, Jack 
Douglas showed the club two mo-
tion pictures, "The State Fair of 
Texas 'and Letter From Ire 
land" 

Aggie Pig Roast 
To Be Held Nov.7 

46 Initiated In 
Sock and Buskin 

Forty-six new members of Sock 
and Buskin were initiated Tuesday 
svening. Try-outs for membership 
were held last week, and applicants 
werejudged by a committee of 
club members. 

New members are Eddie Aryain, 
Norma Barnes. Queenelle Brown. 
Doris Mae Burdette, Barbara Byrd, 
Allorah Byrnes. Edwin Brahaney, 
Nancy Caldwell, Maudie Carpenter, 
Sybil Carter. Jean Cox, Carolyn 
Cox, Lela Craddock, Ann Dilley, 
Patricia Doyle, Gene Dyer. Opal 
Exam, Vernemma Freeman. Bob 
Garber. Betty Gaston, Bea Green, 
Stephen Crane Greggs. 

Dorris FIamrnerschmidt. Billie 
Harp, Myna G. Hicks, Betty Jo 
facasen, Helen McDonald. Sherry 
delver, Vera Herber Maas, Betty 

Geane Martin, Betty Jo 
nerd, Vena Miller. Frank 

orray. Mary Nees. Mary Lou 
Nolen, Paul L. Payne. Hallie Marie 
Pratt. 

Jean Prince, Winston Redwine, 
Doris Richardson, La Vera Riley. 
- Laval Sims, Pat Smoot, Jeanne 
Tucker, Edna M. Underwood, and 
Natalie Watson. 

Pledges were divided into six 
aroups for planning entertainment 
skits to be presented at the next 
meeting. Chairmen of the com-
nitrees are Norma Barnes, Jean 
355. Bob Garber, Vera Barber 
doss. Paul L. Payne, and Pat 

The pledoe of Sock and Buskin 
wae repeated by the new members, 
Ind Kidy Cole, president of the 
'lab, read the club constitution. 
Refreshments were served after 
the business meeting. 

Leidigh And Chappelle 
Attend FFA Officers Meet 

A district meeting of officers of 
high school FFA organizaiions in 
Wert Texas was held Tuesday night 
at Littlefield. A. H. Leidigh, dean 
of the argricultural division, and 
R. L. Chappell, professor of ag-
ricultural education. attended. 

About 75 officers were present 
from this section. 

ball squad, in fact. 
Don lettered two years in high 

school football at Monument and 
won three letters in basketball. 
And, lest we forget, he heaves the 
discus quite a piece. holds his 
county record for tossing the 
platter. 

MAISON - JEANNE 
2418 Broadway 	

- 	

Phone- 2-1552 

All Permanents Reduced to 
Tech Students 

only 

Billie 741912,e44401 
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WANTED 
CARRIER BOYS 

for Avalanche-Journal 

Get into a business of your own' 

Earn extra money while attending school. 

Apply le person to Avalanche-Journal Circulation Dept. 

TODAY•- 
is posi+ivtly the last time to have your 

LA VENTANA 

picture made 

at the 

Palace Studio 
Downtown 

Palace Theater Bldg. 
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