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FT. ELLIOTT ROYALTY: Ft. Elliott's Homecoming was held this past 
Friday evening. Andria Keelin was crowned 2005 Homecoming Queen 
and Justen Bryant was named 2005 Homecoming King. 

- 	• I 

Co. Livestock Show Set For January 28-29 • 

• 
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By Louis C. Stas 
Congratulations, Chance 

Newman, a Ft. Elliott basketball 
player. Chance was named to the 
Amarillo Globe News Athlete of 
the Week Honor Roll. 

—cwe— 
• Congratulations are also in 

order for the Wheeler Mustangs. 
They were ranked #1 in Dist. 2-1A 
Division II. Way to go Mustangs! 

—cwe— 
Congratulations are also in 

order for the Ft. Elliott Lady Cou-
gars. They were ranked #1 in Dist. 
2-1A Division II. Way to go Lady 
Cougars! 

—cwe— 
Have you marked Saturday, 

February 5, 2005, on your calen-
dar. That is the date for the Annual 
Chamber of Commerce Installa-
tion Banquet to be held at the 
Wheeler School Cafeteria. 

—c we— 
It promises to be a very enjoy- 

able evening. 
—cwe— 

Another date to mark is Satur- 
• day, August 6, 2005. Beginning 

Monday, August 1, Wheeler will 
begin celebrating their centennial. 
Saturday will be the big day. 

—ewe— 
The activities during the week 

are not complete, but Friday and 
Saturday are to be the biggest 
days. 

—cwe— 
Lots of food and activities. 

—cwe— 
And, you can still help plan this 

event. The Centennial Committee 
meets the first Tuesday of each 
month at the City Drug Bed and 
Breakfast at 7:00 p.m. Your ideas 
are welcomed and needed! 

—cwe— 
We had a dusting of snow on 

Saturday morning and Sunday 
morning. Not enough to measure. 
And, it was cold. 

—ewe— 
Warning! Lots of individuals are 

having the flu; me included. Fortu-
nately we had the paper finished 

(Continued Page 6) 

O Kelton Exes To Plan 
'05 School Reunion 

Friday night, January 21, 2005, 
at 7:00 p.m. all Kelton Ex-Stu-
dents are invited to attend a plan-
ning meeting for the 2005 reunion. 
The meeting will be at Mel's Diner 
in Wheeler. 

Brittney Mick 

Brittney Mick Is On 
A.C. Honor Roll 

Brittney Mick, daughter of Terry 
and Sheila Mick, of Briscoe has 
been named on the scholastic 
honor roll at Amarillo College. This 
honor consists of students com-
pleting at least twelve semester 
hours with a 3.6 or higher grade- 	A family member ask me how I 
point-average. Brittney is taking come up with the things I write 
the Dental Assisting course where about. Nowthat is a good question 
she will complete her course on with no real answer although I did 
May, 2005. Brittney is working for have a teacher in high school say 
2 years in the office at the Dental to me, "Write about things in your 
Clinic at Amarillo College. 	life, things you know and observe 

around you." Now that was a few 

'Dealing With Grief' might have had the answer. My 
hundred years ago, but think she 

dad always talked about things in 
his life and made it interesting and 
funny most of the time. He had 
quite a sense of humor probably 
due to 5 unruly children of which I 
am the oldest. He was a big tease 
and also could frighten the 
stuffing's out of us. The big chal-
lenge was to race a train to the 
crossing just to hear us kids 
scream. Mother was never on 
these excursions. His other big 
trick was to race the car to the 
edge of a cliff and throw on the 
brakes at the last second and skid 
to the edge. Now that brought out 
our loudest shrieking. Why those 
brakes on that old A model Ford 
worked every time. I will never 
know. Mom was never witness to 
this either, but when sh e was along, 
she made a great back seat driver 
- but we never had as much fun 

The Wheeler County Livestock 
Show will be held on January 28th 
and 29th as follows. 

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS 
Friday, January 28 
8:00 a.m. - Weigh-in of lambs, 

Dr. Smith retired the board into 
executive session at 8:40 pm, in 
accordance with the Texas Open 
Meetings Act, Texas Government 
Code, Chapter 551.074. 

The board returned to open ses-
sion at 10:20 pm. 

Motion by Rhonda McWhorter, 
Second by Mark Tucker, To ap-
prove reassignment and appropri-
ate salary for Sindy Chapman. 
Motion carried unanimously. 

Motion by Kent Vise, Second by 
Mark Tucker, To approve reas-
signment and appropriate salary 
for Dora Sales. Motion carried 
unanimously. 

Motion by Kent Vise, Second by 
Mark Tucker, To approve reas-
signment and appropriate salary 
for Oleta Baker. Motion carried 
unanimously. 

Motion by Dr. Hillhouse, Sec-
ond by Kent Vise, To extend the 
contract of Roy Baker, Superin-
tendent through the 2006-07 
school year. Motion carried unani-
mously. 

Motion by Kent Vise, Second by 
Todd Moore, To adjourn at 10:25 
pm. Motion carried unanimously. 

As appropriate, the Board may 
enter in Closed Meeting as autho-
rized by the Texas Open Meetings 
Act, Government Code, Chapter 
551. Before any meetings are con-
vened, the presiding officer will 
publicly identify the section on the 
Act authorizing the closed meet-
ings. All final votes, actions, or 
decisions will be taken in open 
meetings. 

Ft. Elliott Students 
Are On Honor Roll 

either. I still remember the day dad 
took me and my brother, Don, out 
rabbit hunting. We were the oldest 
and probably only 7 and 10 years 
old. I loved animals and never hurt 

one, but dad insisted on killing one 
to take hometofry. He alsothought 
it was time for me to learn to shoot 
a gun. He handed me his 22 rifle 
and a bullet and said to shoot at 
something. I had a hard time get-
ting the shell into the gun, but 
finally succeeded and I had seen 
him pull the trigger to make it work, 
so that is what I did. Our dog was 
not in sight, so that was a piece of 
good luck, but dad thought I had 
shot myself because the concus-
sion knocked me to the ground. I 
never did weigh much so that old 
gun sent me flying. I think it was a 
year before dad let me try again 
and I learned to stand with a fence 
post or something behind me. 
Through the years, I became a 
pretty good shot but only at tar-
gets. I wonder what dad would say 
if he knew I shot a deer by myself, 
but still with my back tothe wall. He 
would probably say, "You did 
what" Such is life for a southern 
woman. 

Love, Betty  

goats and cattle. 
9:30 a.m. - Lamb Show followed 

by Goat Show. Steer Show and 
Heifer Show. 

Hogs weigh-in after Heifer Show. 
Saturday, January 31 

Alice Bell Helton 

Services Friday For 
Alice Bell Helton, 92 

Alice Bell King Helton, 92, died 
Tuesday, January 11, 2005 in 
Amarillo, Texas. 

Services were at 2:00 p.m. Fri-
day, January 14, 2005 in the First 
United Methodist Church of 
Wheeler. Rev. Ernie McGaughey 
of Tulia, former pastor, and Rev. 
Ricky Carstensen, officiating. 
Burial was in Gageby Cemetery 
under the direction of Wright Fu-
neral Home, Wheeler, Texas. 

Mrs. Helton was born August 1, 
1912 in Hemphill County, Texas to 
Joseph Polk and Fannie Caroline 
King. She married Thomas R. 
Helton on December 17, 1931 in 
Cheyenne, Oklahoma. They were 
married 73 years. She and her 
husband lived on the farm at 
Gageby from 1943 to 1985. They 
then moved to Wheeler to live until 
August 2001 when they moved to 
the Craig Methodist Retirement 
Community in Amarillo, Texas. 
Mrs. Helton was a member of the 
First United Methodist church of 
Wheeler and the Home Demon-
stration Club in Briscoe. 

She was preceded in death by 
her parents, 3 sisters, 1 brother, 1 
grandson, and 1 great-grandson. 

Survivors include her husband, 
Thomas R. Helton Sr. of Amarillo, 
Texas; 1 daughter, Joyce Smith 
and husband, Joe Paul Smith, of 
Sayre, Oklahoma; 4 sons, Tho-
mas R. Helton Jr. and wife, Martha, 
of Wheeler, Texas, Jack Helton 
and wife, Sharon, of Wheeler, 
Texas, Bob Helton and wife, 
Lavada, of Marbles Falls, Texas, 
and Bill Helton and wife, Phyllis, of 
Amarillo, Texas; 19grandchildren; 
45 great-grandchildren; 10 great-
great-grandchildren. 

Memorial requests are to the 
Building Fund for the First Meth-
odist Church of Wheeler or 
Champlin program at the Craig 
Retirement Community. 

RECOGNIZED: Chance Newman, 
a Ft. Elliott basketball player was 
named to Amarillo Globe-News 
Athlete of the Week Honor Roll. 
Chance scored 25 points in an 88-
45 win over Higgins on Friday. 

Ben Dollar Named 
To ENMU Honor Roll 

Robert Dollar, an Eastern New 
Mexico University student from 
Wheeler, TX, is among the 603 
Students on the 2004 fall semes-
ter Dean's Honor Roll. 

To be eligible for the Dean's 
Honor Roll students must com-
plete a minimum of 15 hours for 
the semester and maintain a 3.25 
GPA. ENMU opened in 1934 and 
today has an enrollment of ap-
proximately 3900 on its main cam-
pus in Portales. Eastern, which 
also has a branch campus in 
Roswell and in instructional center 
in Ruidoso, offers 60 undergradu-
ate and graduate programs. Dollar 
is majoring in university studies. 

President Kelvin W. Sharp of 
South Plains College has awarded 
those students who have attained 
a grade point average of 4.0 dur-
ing the past semester. Tiffany Hall 
Johnson was awarded the Presi-
dents Honor Roll certificate. 

Tiffany is married to Bryan 
Johnson. They have two children  

8:00 a.m. - Swine Show 
5:00 p.m. - Free Meal provided 

by the Junior Livestock Show 
Board 

The Wheeler County 4-H Clubs 
and FFA Organizations have been 
busy preparing their animals for 
the local shows and the County 
Show. 

The Shamrock local show will 
be held on Saturday, January 22 
at 11:30 A.M. in Shamrock. 4 
Goats, 6 Lambs, 3 Steers, 23 Pigs 

The Wheeler local show will be 
held on Thursday, January 27, at 
5:00 PM at the Wheeler County 
Earn. 1 Goat, 17 Lambs, 2 Heifers, 

Mid-American Research Chemi-
cal Corporation, better known as 
MARC, held their annual conven-
tion in San Diego, CA. Dallas 
FillInglm, Territory Manager, was 
honored with many different 
awards that he was presented 
before his peers at the historical U 
S Grant Hotel Ballroom. 

Among those awards that Dal-
las was presented were: 2nd 
straight year to earn Century Club 
Level, which was $125,000 of 
sales; 1st time entry into Century 
Club II, which is over $200,000 
sales; earned $550.00 in Califor-
nia Bucks contest; earned $200 
extra cash for Century Club II; 
received a second diamond in 
Century Club ring and his spouse 
received a pendant with a dia-
mond; increased sales from 
$156,000 in 2003 to $250,000 plus 
in 2004; Earned 10 President's 
Awards and $5000.00 for these 
awards and President's Plaque; 
received many extra incentive gifts 
for 2004. Dallas received the Ex-
panding the Globe trophy and 
$100.00 for having the most new 
accounts in the company. Most 
importantly, Dallas received, for 
the second year in a row, the com-
pany Outstanding Improvement 
Award which is awarded for the 
most improved sales increase, 
closing sales percentage, aver-
age sale amount and average 
sales in a week and period. 

ALLISIM 
NEWS 

By Juanita Boydston 
And he that searcheth the hearts 

knoweth what is the mind of the 
Spirit, because he maketh 
intersession for the saints accord-
ing to the will of God. And we know 
that all things work together for 
good to them that love God, to 
them who are the called according 
to his purpose. Romans 8: 278. 28 

The weather here in Allison has 
been very very COLD and WINDY. 
Sunday we had ice crystals falling 
from the sky and it covered the 
ground but didn't last long. But 
they were beautiful. It wasn't slick, 
just really pretty. Today its to be 
lots warmer than the last few days. 
At night we have been getting in 
single digits and not much above 
thru the day. But the sun is shining 
today and its looking better and 

Hospital Notes 
Assisted Living  

Odra Christopher 
Glenn Williams 
Verne Lohberger 
Opal Hefley 
Alvern Hutchison 
C. B. Brotherton 

New Admissions  
1/8 	Kelton Hill 
1/11 	Carte Peach 

Arnold Jones 
1/12 	Ann Killingsworth 
1/16 	Irene Taylor 
Dismissals  
1/10 	James Smith 
1/11 	Tim Parsley 

Kelton Hill 
1/12 	Elaine James 

Lola Smith 
1/13 	Arnold Jones 
1/14 	Carle Peach 
1/15 	Ann Killingsworth 

and reside in Lubbock, TX. She is 
the daughter of Melissa and Mark 
Hampton of Wheeler and Jerry 
and Lanay Hall of San Antonio, 
TX. She is the granddaughter of 
Jack and Bernice Hefley of 
Mobeetie, TX and the great-grand-
daughter of Opal Hefley of 
Wheeler, TX. 

6:00p.m. - Awards Program and 
Premium Sale ' 

The total number of animals that 
will be shown is: 7 Goats, 36 
Lambs, 10 Steers, 2 Heifers, 113 
Pigs 

2 Steers, 34 Pigs 
The Fort Elliott local show will 

follow the Wheeler local show 2 
Goats, 13 Lambs, 5 Steers, 56 
Pigs 

The County Show will kick off on 
Friday, January 28 at 9:30 AM with 
the Lamb Show followed by the 
Heifer Show and Steer Show. The 
Pig Show will begin at 8:00 AM on 
Saturday, January 29, 2005. The 
awards and sale will begin at 6:00 
PM on Saturday, January 29,2005. 

Dallas FIllingim 

MARC was founded in 1970 in 
the heart of the United States. 
From a modest beginning, MARC 
has grown into a modern blending 
fad lity producing and marketing 
over 400 sanitary maintenance-
related products, which are re-
garded as industry standards of 
quality. MARC is directly repre-
sented in the field by a highly mo-
tivated and professional sales staff. 

Dallas his wife, Krystal, and new 
daughter, Keaira, reside in Wichita 
Falls, Texas. He was a 1992gradu-
ate of Briscoe High School. Ac-
companying Dallas to San Diego 
were his parents, Rita and David 
Pearson of Canadian. 

the wind isn't blowing like usual. 
Last week news -- Visitors to the 

home of Gary and Julie Boydston 
on New Year's Eve were Tori and 
Hannah Boydston from Stinnett, 
Texas, Kaylye and Gavin Boydston 
from Amarillo, Texas, Logan and 
Gavin Robertson from Leedy, 
Oklahoma, Jody Robertson from 
Sweetwater, Oklahoma, Rhonda 
and Jocelyn Robertson from 
Reydon, Oklahoma and Melvin and 
Judi Walser from Allison, Texas. 
They played games, had a dance, 
watched movies and just had a 
good time. On New Years Day, 
Doug, Amie and Ryne Purcell f rom 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma came 
to join the group and stayed for a 
few days. 

Thursday, Pearl Harrison ac-
companied Louise Boydston to Elk 
City, Oklahoma on business and 
they visited in the home of Jimmy 
and Vivian Wallace. On the way to 
Elk, they stopped in Cheyenne, 
Oklahoma where they visited 
Thursia Poindexter and Oscar 
Hammon at the Nursing Center. 

Thursday, Glenn and Betty 
Boydston traveled to Elk City, Okla-
homa on business and enjoyed a 
delicious meal at the Country Cook-
ing. 

Friday evening, Opal Boydston 
accompanied Glenn and Betty 
Boydston to Reydon, Oklahoma 
where they enjoyed a very deli-
cious meal at the Reydon Senior 
Citizen's Building. Vance and Carol 
Boydston and Juanita Boydston 
and Nelda Dukes met them there 
and had a good time of visiting and 
eating. Others from Allison that 
were there while we were there 
were Virginia Puryear, Edna May 
and Lou Dean Douthit from 
Briscoe. 

Tuesday night after church, 
Vance and Carol Boydston, Opal 
and Juanita Boydston gathered in 
the home of Glenn and Betty 
Boydston. They visited and great 
refreshments were served and of 
course a game of spinners was 
played. 

Vance and Carol Boydston vis-
ited i n the home of Opal and Juanita 
Boydston on Thursday evening 
and yes we played a game of 
spinners. 

Friday evening, Juanita 
Boydston accompanied Vance and 
Carol Boydston to Wheeler where 
they attended to business and 

(Continued Page 5) 

• Unapproved Minutes 
Regular Board Meeting 

January 13, 2005 
The Wheeler ISD Board of Trust-

ees met for a regular schedule 
meeting January 13,2005. Dr. Mike 
Smith called the meeting to order 
at 6:37 P.M. LeeAnn Hillhouse led 
the pledge; Kent Vise offered the 
invocation. 

All board members were 
present. School personnel present 
were Roy Baker, Doug Rives, and 
Stacey Horton. 

There were no individuals or 
groups that wished to address the 
board. 

Motion by Dr. Hillhouse, Sec-
ond by Jauna Benefield, To ap-
prove the December 8, 2004 board 
minutes as amended. Motion car-
ried unanimously. 

Motion by Kent Vise, Second by 
Todd Moore, To approve payment 
of December accounts. Motion 
carried unanimously. 

Mr. Baker gave the monthly fi-
nancial statement. 

Motion by Dr. Hillhouse, Sec-
ond by Jauna Benefield, To ap-
provethe 2003-04 audit by Charles 
Kuntz, CPA. Motion carried unani-
mously. 

The Board discussed alterna-
tives for flooring in the gym foyer 
and bleachers. 

The Board was recessed at 7:55 
and resumed at 8:00. 

Motion by Jauna Benefield, Sec-
ond by Kent Vise, To approve the 
Board Update 74. Motion carried 
unanimously. 

Motion by Dr. Hillhouse, Sec-
ond by Mark Tucker, To approve 
the 2005-06 school calendar as 
presented. Motion carried unani-
mously. 

Mr. Rives gave the principal's 
report. 

Mr. Baker gave the 
superintendent's report. 

For E. J. Meadows 

Is Program Topic 
Dealing with Grief, aka "Grief 

101" John Southern of BSA Hos-
pice will provide a time of sharing, 
learning and growing for every-
one who is dealing with grief and 
loss issues in their personal lives 
or in their profession. This could 
be a recent loss, or grief from a 
loss not-so-recent. Either way, 
come and hear what John has to 
say. A special invitation is issued 
to all school personnel and stu-
dents. The meeting will be held on 
Thursday, Jan. 20 from 6-8pm, 
in thefellowship hall at the Wheeler 
Methodist Church, Sponsored by 
First Baptist Church of Wheeler, 
St. Mary's Catholic Church of 
Wheeler, Wheeler Church of 
Christ, and Wheeler Methodist 
Church 

E.J. Meadows, 66, died 
Wednesday, January 12, 2005 in 
Amarillo, Texas, 

Services were at 2:00 p.m. Sat-
urday, January 15, 2005 in the 
Church of Christ in Wheeler. Dick 
Irvine pastor of the First United 
Methodist Church of Mobeetie of-
ficiating. Burial was in the Wheeler 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Wright Funeral Home, Wheeler, 
Texas. 

Mr. Meadows was born June 
13, 1938 in WheelerCounty, Texas 
to B.F. and Margie Meadows. E.J. 
attended school in Briscoe. Mr. 
Meadows was a member of the 
American Legion and had served 
in the United States Navy from 
1956 until 1962. He married Joy 
Welch on June 11,1964 in Allison, 
Texas. He was a self-employed 
contractor in the oil field service. 

He was preceded in death by 
his father and two sisters. 

Survivors include his wife, Joy 
of Wheeler, Texas; 1 daughter, 
Misty Meadows of Amarillo, Texas; 
1 son, Keivin and wife Michelle 
Meadows of Llano, Texas; 5 grand-
children, Jerald, Kim, and Sarah 
Meadows and Jennifer and Kelsey 
Brumfield; his mother, Margie 
Meadows of Wheeler, Texas; 3 
brothers, Brady Meadows of 
Wheeler, Texas, Richard Mead-
ows of Brisoce, Texas, and John 
Meadows of Wimberly, Texas. 

Memorial requests are to the 
Circle of Friends of the Harrington 
Cancer Center, 

Wheeler School Board Meets; 
Assignments Changes Made 

3rd Six Weeks 
1st Grade: All A's—Tiffany 
Hovey, Bailey McAlphine, Dalton 
McDowell, Devon McDowell, Keli 

Rites Are Read Suderman, Matt Williams; All A's & B's—Jace Forward, Landon 
Helton, Justin Smith 
2nd Grade: All A's—Blake 
Hathaway, Kaylynn Kiker, Larami 
Lancaster, Brayden Trimble; All 
A's & B's—Braxton Williams 
3rd Grade: All A's—Jessica Alls, 
Shea Suderman; All A's & B's—
Houston Barr, Haley Barton, Kasey 
Barton, Jayton Childress, Cody 
Clark, Ethan Johnson, Jacob 
McDowell, Zane Zybach 
4th Grade: All A's & B's —Bran-
don Hathaway, Shawn Hudson-
Crowe, Kathy Kelley, Tracy Win- 
ter ; 	Wyant 

(tirade: All A's & B's —Jada 
Hathaway, Andrea Martinez 
6th Grade: All A's—Dawson 
Clark, Gatlin Duncan, Sarah Horn, 
Matt Kiker 
7th Grade: All A's—Morgan 
McDowell; All A's & B's—Blake 
Baker, Hayden Duncan, Colbey 
Hanson 
8th Grade: All A's—Bailey Estes, 
Stormi Lancaster; All A's & B's—
Leslie Archer, Hailey Estes, Bran-
don Finsterwald, Sara Hathaway, 
Megan Horn, Amber Maddox, Clay 
White 
9th Grade: All A's—Jordan Alls, 
Mayci Meadows; All A's & B's—
Tina Covalt, Cody Dupont, Tommy 
Meek, Chance Newman 
10th Grade: All A's & B's —Glory 
Hartsfield 
11th Grade: All A's—Kelsey 
Zybach; All A's & B's—Blaine 
Baker, Jessica Helton, J. W. Lane, 
Sarah Zybach 
12th Grade: All A's—Jason 
Boydston, Russell Lohberger; All 
A's & B's—Andrea Hathaway, 
Tamara Hefley, Andria Keelin 

The View of a Southern Woman 
Southern California :hat is . . 

Tiffany Johnson Is On SPC Honor Roll 

Shamrock, Wheeler & Ft. Elliott Shows 

MARC Recognizes Dallas Fillingim 



THESE PICTURES SPONSORED BY: 

FIRST STATE BANK 
"The Bank with Friendly Service" 

-• 

Mobeetie Office: 

First & Wheeler St. 
Mobeetie, Texas 

• 

845-2311 

Wheeler Office: 

1408 S. Alan Bean Blvd. 
Wheeler, Texas 

826-5546 
Established 1906 
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Member: 

Shealee Coulter, #5, is up for two in the fvlramr 
game. 

Russell Lohberger, #21, moves the ball down the 
court in the Miami game. The boys put another 
on the Win side, 86 to 45. 

The ball goes back into play in the Miami game; 
Nathan.McLaughlin, #11, and Kelsey Zybach, 
#23, are ready to accept responsibility. 

Jason Boydston, #4, guards the Miami Warrior. 

Andrea Hathaway, #2; Glory Hartsfield, #11, 
and team mates guard their Higgins opponent. 
Higgins was defeated 62 to 20. 

Andria Keelin, #25, is after the bail in the Higgins 
game. 

Alicia ReiS, #10, is up for two in the Miami game. 
Miami was defeated 71 to 33. 

 

.. 
.Andrea Hathaway, in the Higgins 

  

   

fr 

 

Russell Lohberger, #21, stands ready to capture 
the ball in the Miami game. 

MOBEETIE 
MEWS 
By: Sue Mayfield 
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'Wheeler, town of friendship rind prob.." 

ENGAGEMENT AND WEDDING ANNOUNCEMENTS: Van and Rene' 
Baize of Bowie, Texas announce the engagement of their daughter, 
Vanessa Rene', to Scott Christian Coffman both of Lafayette, Louisi-
ana. He is the son of Nancy and Earl Holder of Houston, Texas and Jack 
and Ada Coffman of Lakeway, Texas. The bride-elect attended Wheeler 
schools for 10 years and is a 1997 graduate of Canadian High School. 
She is a 2001 graduate of Texas Tech University Health Sciences 
Center with a Bachelor's of Science degree in Nursing. She is currently 
employed in Pediatric Nursing with Women's and Children's Hospital 
in Lafayette, Louisiana. The prospective bridegroom is a 1992 graduate 
of Stratford High School in Houston and a 1996 graduate of Texas A&M 
University with a Bachelor's of Science degree in Aquaculture. He is 
currently employed with New Century Productions out of Fredericksburg, 
Texas organizing outdoor hunting and fishing expos in Texas and 
Louisiana. The wedding has been set for Saturday, April 9, at Old Glory 
Ranch in Wimberly, Texas. 

prestige group. 
Such an honor! We are very 

proud of him. (The weather better 
be nice that weekend.) 

Good to know that Judy Cloud's 
knee replacement went so well. 
Her recuperation and therapy has 
been great. She had graduated to 
just using a cane. Judy is waiting 
now to hear what the Dr. wants to 
do about her other knee. 

Happy belated birthday Kyrah 

News, Views, Commentary 

On XPDR, 90.5 
... in Wheeler 

Weekdays 6:20 a.m. to 7 a.m. 

@lemOD c)0 GIS 
In the adult Bible class at the 

Church of Christ in Wheeler, 
we have been studying the first 
eleven chapters in the book of 
Genesis. For most of us, this 
might be the first time we have 
studied these passages since 
we were young children in Sun-
day School. And admittedly it 
does have within it some of the 
fun and simple Bible stories 
that we might fondly recall: the 
creation, Adam and Eve, Noah 
and the flood, the Tower of 
Babel. But what we have dis-
covered in our recent study is 
that these "children's stories" 
are intended for adults, too. 
We have also discovered that 
there are a number of challeng-
ing and difficult-to-handle situ-
ations. What we end up with is 
more questions than answers. 
The stock answer I have to 
frequently give is this: "I don't 
know." 

A few that we have already 
handled include questions like, 
what was here beforecreation? 

If God created everything, then 
why did he create within us the 
possibility for sin, or, why did 
God create Satan? How long 
was a day back in the begin-
ning? What does being created 
in God's own image mean? 

And that is by no means the 
end to the questions that have 
been, and will be raised. The 
early conclusion we have 
reached, though, is that the early 
part of Genesis was not recorded 
to be specifically scientific or spe-
cifically historical. It is instead 
intended to be theological. After 
reading this section of the Bible, 
the reader is supposed to go 
away without the answer to ev-
ery question, but the understand-
ing that God does know all of the 
answers. We should end uptrust-
ing that God is in control of ev-
erything. 

We will continue in this study 
for a little while. You are invited 
and encouraged to be a part of 
this class. See you at the Church 
of Christ. 

Shawn D. Johnson 

An Invitation: You are cordially in-
vited to attend any of the weekly 
services of the Wheeler Church of 
Christ which meets at 1001 S. Alan 
Bean Blvd, in Wheeler, Texas 

Services: 
Sunday Bible Study 	 10:00 A.M. 
Sunday Morning Worship . 10:55 A.M. 
Sunday Night Worship ...... 6:00 P.M. 
Wednesday Bible Study 	7:00 P.M. 

WHEELER COMMUNITY 

CHURCH 
Rev. Alberta and Pat Helton 

806-323-9849 or 826-5607 
P.O. Box 544 

Wheeler, TX 79096 

801 Alan L.Bean Blvd. 	John 14: 6: "Jesus saith unto him. 

Sundays-6:300 P.M. 	I am the way, the truth and the life; 

—WELCOME— 	no man cometh unto the Father but by me " 

MARSHALL'S 

HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING 
WHEELER, TX—PHONE: 664-5395—CELL: 662-7876 

TIRANE' 
IlardTo Stop A Trane 24 Hour Emergency Service— 

LICENSED & INSURED 
License No. TACLB022710E 

Mark Marshall, Owner 

NOW DOING 

AIR DUCT CLEANING 

Brrr! This last winter chill sure 
goes to your bones. Just thankful 
we didn't have any iceto deal with. 
Sure hope the weather forecast-
ers are right and mild weather is on 
the way. 

Last Wed. I droved to Amarillo 
and met my mother, Carol 
Orthman, and my brother and sis-
ter-in-law, Keith and Karen 
Sorensen, all of Dumas for dinner. 

We ate dinner at Furr's cafeteria 
and then drove on to Hereford to 
visit a little with Jessica and Jamie 
Kapka and Emily and Aaron and 
Lori Sorensen at the Kapka resi-
dence. 

We all attended Zelma "Nanny" 
Warrens funeral. It was at 3:00 
p.m. and wind was already, colder 
and the clouds getting darker. 

After the funeral we stopped by 
the home of Jim and Alice Ash for 
coffee and a short visit. 

Had thought about eating sup-
per together in Amarillo. But be-
fore we got to Amarillo, ran into 
some pretty heavy blowing snow. 
Big beautiful flakes. So I chickened 
out, offered a rain "snow" check 
and stopped to get gas. We all 
decided just to head home. 

The Dumas family members ran 
out of the snow after they crossed 
the Canadian River bridge and 
topped the hill. The snow had left 
about an inch of the white stuff, but 
roads was good. 

I ran out of the heavy stuff by the 
time I got to Panhandle. Had some 
flurries all the way to the Celanese 
plant. But roads were good. 

Sorry, I got some information 
wrong last week. I hope Tommy 
and Nicole Fletcher will forgive 
me, for having him married to 
someone else. Tommy's wife is 
Nicole not Rachel. And Tommy 
and Nicole have a beautiful son, 
not a baby girl. 

Tommy and Nicole's son, Adam 
Trey, will have alot of fun growing 
up with his cousin, Marcus And ruw 
Fletcher. 

Grandma Frankie Fletcher and 
Grandpa Clif Fletcher are very 
proud of these sweet boys. 

Frankie is doing much better. 
She is at home with her parents for 
a while. Doing better every day. 
Her progress is very impressive. 
Keep up the good work Frankie. 
Your in our prayers. 

Many thanks to the "Little Birdie" 
that gave me the correct informa-
tion and great news about Frankie. 

Thanks for taking the time to 
read this column. 

It was so nice to see Jerry and 
Sharon Horton. Glad everyone is 
doing well. They were having lunch 
with their son, Jerry Don, and his 
co-worker and Tommy Puryear. 

Ericka and Aaron are living in 
Amarillo. She is working on her 
masters degree in physiology and 
working at Boys Ranch. She loves 
her job. 

Glad that Gene and Louise 
Shorter are back home. Hope your 
feeling better Gene. 

Pvt. Cynthia Cloud was home 
over the weekend to visit her 
mother, Judy Cloud, and her grand-
parents, Gene and Louise Shorter. 
She is stationed at Wichita Falls. 
She loves her job. She is in the 
clerical pool. 

Our sympathy to Thomas Helton 
Sr. and the family and friends of 
Alice Bell Helton. She was a very 
special lady that touched so many 
lives. She will be greatly missed. 

Alice is survived by her loving 
husband of over 70 yrs. along with 
one daughter, Joyce Smith and 
her husband, Joe Paul, of Sayre, 
Oklahoma; and four sons, Tho-
mas HeltonJr.and hiswife, Martha, 
and Jack Helton and wife, Sharon, 
all of Wheeler, and Bob Helton 
and wife, Lavada, of Marble Falls 
and Bill Helton and wife, Phyllis, of 
Amarillo. She is also survived by 
19 grandchildren, 45 great-grand-
children and 10 beautiful great-
great-grandchildren. 

Alice Bell was so proud of her 
family. 

Our Cougars and Lady Cougars 
are having a great basketball sea-
son. The Lady Cougars are #1 in 
district 2-1A Division II with 3-0 in 
district games and 15-4 over all. 
The Cougar Boys are #2 behind 
Wheeler in district 2-1A Division II 
competition. They have posted a 
2-0 in district wins and 12-6 over-
all. 

They are pushing hard. We are 
very proud of them. 

The Panhandle Bluegrass As-
sociation had its winter jam fest in 
Amarillofrom last Thursday til noon 
on Sunday. Quite a get together! 
Lots of good music and visiting. 

Tex and Eva McKnight sent a 
big "hello" to all their friends over 
here. Tex is recovering nicely from 
a light stroke that he suffered in 
Oct. 

Our deepest sympathy to Joy 
Meadows and the family and 
friends of E.J. Meadows in his 
death. 

He is also survived by a daugh-
ter, Misty of Amarillo and son, 
Keivin and family, his mother, 
Margie Meadows of Wheeler; 3 
brothers, Brady Meadows of 
Wheeler, Richard Meadows of 
Briscoe, and John Meadows of 
Wimberly, Texas; and 5 grandchil-
dren. 

He will be greatly missed. He 
had so many friends and a loving 
family. 

Michael Mayfield from OKC 
called us to invite us to a very 
special concert on February 191h. 
He was chosen for the Boys Honor 
Choir group that will be singing 
with the OK chorale, an exclusive 
Mens Choral group from the OKC 
area. There were only 4 boys from 
his 7th grade class to sing with this 

• 

• 

Kelley. She turned 5 on Sun., Jan. 
16th. Kyrah celebrated at home 
after church with many friends to 
help her celebrate. They had lunch 
and birthday cake. She had lots of 
fun opening her birthday gifts. 

Mark Feb. 9th on your calen-
dars. Both the Mobeetie Post of-
fice and Wheeler will have a spe-
cial Valentine Cancellation cel-
ebration. So get your cards ready. 

Both facilities will be having an 
open house as a celebration to 
enjoy the first day cancellation. 

Mobeetie's will include a retire-
ment tea for Sue Mayfield. 

Lets keep these friends and 
neighbors in our prayers: Gene 
and Louise Shorter, Don and Mary 

(Continued Page 5) 
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'OS & FAITH, HOPE, 	LOVE 
Womens' Conference 
' 	Friday 	 Concert featuring Paul Christian 

Feb. 11th 	
Friday night starting at 7pm 

& 	 Saturday starts off at 9am with one of 

Saturday 	 Trinity Fellowship's Praise Teams 

Feb. I2th 

Early Registration $25.00 
Day of Registration $35.00 

FOR REGISTRATION INFORMATION, CONTACT 

STEPHANIE CHILDRESS 

(580) 928-2345 	

4 al 

CHILDRESS@TRINITY I .ORG 	 Tiacylia &ran 
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • le 

Trinity Fellowship 

Between Exits 25 & 26 - Sayre, OK 73662 	m 	i. 	. 	rt4 	I 	-T 	Y 
www.trinity1.org 

COME AND BE A PART OF THE EXCITEMENT IN WESTERN OKLAHOMA AT 

TRINITY FELLOWSHIP IN SAYRE.  

Get Your Refund 
RIM 

Because It's Your Money 

Get Your Tax Refund FAST 
with Electronic Filing! 

ALVEY 
Tax & Accounting Service 

101 E Oklahoma St. — (806) 826-3736 
Mon.-Fri. — 9:00 A.M.-6:00 P.M. 

Sat.-9:00 A.M.-1:00 P.M. 

Wheeler, Texas 79096 

citsefile 

v1/410111W AY SU P E rp a a  
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Your source for the freshest 
PRODUCE • MEAT • DAIRY ti 

WHEELER COUNTY'S EXCLUSIVE 
SOURCE FOR PLAINS & SHURFINE PRODUCTS. 

ayoRK,e--=- 
SALES & SERVICE 

"A Flush...1s 
Better Than a 

Thr 	Full House!!! 

• • Mathew 25:34-40: Then the King 
will say to those on the right, come 
you, who are blessed by my Fa 
titer, inherit the Kingdom prepared 
for you from the foundation of the 
world. For I was hungry and you 
fed me. I was thirsty and you gave 
me a drink. I was a stranger and 
you invited me into your home, I 
was naked and you gave me cloth-
ing. t was sick and you cared for 
me. I was in prison and you visited 
me, I assure you, when you did it 
unto one of the least of these my 
brothers and sisters, you did it 
unto me." 

Happy Birthday to Debbie 
Gfassey, Jordan Moore, Randy 
Martin, Mark Cornett, Alvin 
Reeves, Andrea Auldridge, Stiles 
Vaughn Christner II, Scott Draper 

•
on Jan. 23; Caroline Cornett, David 
Zybach, Emma Swigart, Lisa 
Bennett, Susan (Nelson) 
Reichstat, Sabine Brown, Kathy 
Knibbs, Barbara Beard. Deidra 
Sales on Jan. 24; Jackie 
Cummings. Carlene Steward, 
James Chapman and Brad Mas- 

i. 

	

	ters on Jan. 25; Lori Debase, Abree 
Finsterwald, Misty Zybach 
Fairchild, Gary Don Forrester, Jake 
Britt, Betty Talley, Gordon Estes, 
Red Dukes, James Light on Jan. 
26. 

Happy Birthday to Katie Shipp, 
Danyell Hughes, Gwen Loyd, 
Rylee Rives, Betty Weaver, Jan 
Garrison, Blake Barnes, Don Burke 
on Jan. 27; Carolyn Hef ley, Hunter 
Mendiola, Bernice Hefley on Jan. 
28; Jacob Reynolds, Hailey Moon, 
Wanda Christie, Michael Hilburn, 
Cory Sides on Jan. 29. 

Happy Anniversay to Mike and 
Melody Goad on Jan. 24. 

Wheeler Golden Agers will meet 
at noon Thurs., Jan. 20, at Wheeler 
Baptist Church. Everyone wel-
come for pot-luck meal and visit- 

in Follett • Follett High School basketball 
teams will come play Ft. Elliott at 
Briscoe Friday, Jan. 21, at 6:30. 

Ft. Elliott Little Dribblers Tour-
nament will be Saturday at Briscoe, 
Jan. 22. It is sponsored by Ft. 
Elliott Seniors and will be played in 

• 
both gyms by grades 3, 4, 5 & 6. 
Some teams entered are Kelton, 
Wheeler, Shamrock, Follett, 
Higgins, Wellington, Ft. Elliott. 
Games start at 8:30 a.m. and last 
games at 8:30 p.m. Have Fun! 

Lefors Junior High basketball 
teams will come to Ft. Elliott Mon-
day night, Jan. 24, at 6:00 at 
Briscoe, 

Et. Elliott High School basket-
ball teams will play at Wheeler 
Tuesday night, Jan. 25, at 6:30. 

Good to see Orville Greenhouse 
- and -Lorene Rector shopping at 
Thriftway Tuesday. Such sweet 
and bubbly ladies. They have so 
much fun together. 

Sincere sympathy to family and 
friends of Gladys Smyth, 97, in her 
death. She lived many years going 
to Fun Bunch and playing 42. Such 
a sweet lady. 

Correction: Fat and Wanda 
Childress also visited at Leola 
Stuarts Sunday, Jan. 9, for pot- 

CIMEWS 
By Verna Fillingim 

luck meal and games of domi-
noes. 

Cindy Bradstreet visited her 
mom, Lois Barrett, at Pampa Fri-
day night. They shopped some at 
Wal-Mart and ate supper at the 
China Dragon buffets Saturday 
night. Roy and Nell Bradstreet and 
Wes and Cindy went back to 

MONDAY, January 24, 2005 — 
FRIDAY, January 28, 2005 
MONDAY 
Breakfast: Cold Cereal, Toast, 
Jelly, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Hot Dog, Chili, Pork n' 
Beans, Pickle Spears, Peaches, 
Milk 
TUESDAY 
Breakfast: Cereal, Toast, Juice, 
Milk 
Lunch: Veg. Beef Coup, Grilled 
Cheese, Lettuce Salad, Crackers, 
Pears, Milk 
WEDNESDAY 
Breakfast: Cereal or Pancake 
Pup, Toast, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Chicken Nuggets, Gravy, 
Mashed Potatoes, Corn, Hot Roll, 
Applesauce, Milk 
THURSDAY 

a  Breakfast: Biscuit and Gravy, 
Sausage, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Beef Chalupas, Lettuce 
Salad, Refried Beans, Pineapple, 
Milk 
FRIDAY 
Breakfast: French Toast Bagel, 
Cereal, Juice, Milk 

• Lunch: Hamburgers, Sliced 
Cheese, Tater Tots, Carrot Sticks, 
Mandarin Oranges, Milk 
(Menu subject to change) 

• 

• THRIFTWAY SUPERMARKET 
300 EAST OKLAHOMA 

WHEELER 
826-5944 PHONE 826-3345 1. 1\ 

life 
By everything we do and say, 
So let's make sure the fruit we 

reap 
Comes from the good we do 

each day." 
—from Daily Bread 

Sunday was Sanctity of Life 
Sunday. Bro. Dennis Williams had 

Pampa and ate at the China 
Dragon. They also saw Virginia 
Patterson and Patsy Caswell there 
and Marshall and Mary Andis. 

Johnny Wilson will be Big 50 
Tuesday, Jan. 18. and is planning 
a little party at Mel's Diner. Happy 
Birthday Johnny. God Bless You! 

"We're always sowing seeds in 

MARKET SQUIRE THRIFTWAY 
205 EAST THIRD 

SHAMROCK 
256-2-181 PHONF 256-5060 FAX 

a hard hitting message about how 
God feels about abortion (mur-
der), homosexuality and divorce. 
But God loves us and forgives our 
sins and wants to restore us. 

Samantha Chapman sang "I 
surrender all to Jesus." Beautifully 
done. More unborn babies are 
killed than all the soldiers and oth-
ers. What a disgrace. They harmed 
no one. 

Sunday, Jan. 30, will be Baptist 
Men's Day with men in choir and 
taking part in things in the morning 
service. Sunday night, Jan. 30, at 
6:00 p.m. will be 5th Sunday Sing-
ing. Everyone invited to come par-
ticipate, sing, play an instrument, 
read poem or give a testimony. 

Nice to visit with a pleasant new 
lady at Wheeler Care Center, 
Gelemia Backfrom McLean. (Hope 
I spelled her name right.) 

Nice to visit with Janet Stevens 
at the Post Office. Daughter, 
Brooke, and husband are expect-
ing a baby boy about May 1. (Com-
plicated because Brooke has rheu-
matoid arthritis and needs medi-
cations to help with pain. Remem-
ber them in your prayers. Another 
note: Daughter, Nikki (Scott) 
Robinson, is engaged to marry 
Dean Hathaway and is also start-
ing nursing school at Clarendon. 
God bless you all. 

Sarita Dawson and Shelby and 
Micaela from Amarillo spent Fri-
day night with Sarita's parents, 
Laurel and Ed Hershman, and 
celebrated Shelby's 5th birthday. 
They all went on to Ft. Sill Satur-
day to spend three days with their 
dad, Brad Dawson. No school on 
Monday: Martin Luther King Day. 
The girls sure do miss their dad. 
Mom does too. Happy Birthday, 
Shelby. 

Ft. Elliott Girls High School bas-
ketball team defeated Higgins 62-
20 and boys defeated Higgins 88-
45. Congratulations. 

Friday night at Briscoe, it was 
also Homecoming for Ft. Elliott. 
Andrea Keelin was queen and 
Justen Bryant was king. Congratu-
lations to all. Andria is the daugh-
ter of Angela Keelin and Glenn 
and Tracy Keelin. Justen is the 
son of Stacci and Brad Reis. 

Thank you, Laurel and Ed 
Hershman for remembering your 
old Aunt Verna when you saw the 
little watermellons at Albertsons at 
Pampa. Very good! God bless you! 
Also thanks a bunch for the two big 
watermellons, too. See how 
spoiled I'm getting?Suregood eat-
ing! 

Sincere sympathy to family and 
friends of E. J. Meadows, 66, of 
Wheeler in his death. Funeral was 
Saturday at Wheeler Church of 
Christ with family dinner there, also. 
Dick Irvine, pastor of Mobeetie 
Methodist Church officiated. We 
are sorry to see him go. 

Mike and Josh Bryant and Wes 
Bradstreet got back O.K. from their 
ski trip to Taos, N.M. late Wednes-
day night. 

Congratulations to Kade Zybach 
of Briscoe and Sandra Rose of 
Wheeler for making the President's 
Honor Roll at Southwestern Okla-
homa University at Weatherford 
and to Kelby Lane and Glenda 
Pinion for being on the Dean's 
Honor Roll from Allison. 

Correction: Melia Hill was 102 
on Jan. 20. She is the perky resi-
dent of Wheeler Care Center. God 
bless you! 

Thanks Earl and Betty Hustead 
and Rosalie Keelin for the good 
sing-a-long and service at Wheeler 
Care Center Tuesday, Jan. 11. 
Always enjoy it. 

Bob and Evangeline Wills went 
to see their daughter, Beth Wills. 
She had a slipped disk. Remem-
ber her in your prayers. Bob and 
Evangeline spent the week with 
Beth at Mansfield, getting back 
Friday night. Beth is much better 
with therapy, medication and tak-
ing it easier. 

Bevard and Diane Dukes and 
Andrea Auldridge and Tayton and 
Tysen went to Amarillo Friday and 
painted the nursery and did things 
to help Deidre Harris. Tracy came 
up Saturday. His sister kept their 
boys and they celebrated their 7th 
wedding anniversary with supper 
at Ruby Tequillas and a movie. 
Best wishes to all! Keep praying 
for Deidre Harris and her unborn 
baby girl. 

Casey Tipps was one of 18 who 
went to All Regional Band Concert 
from Candian to Amarillo Friday 
and Saturday. Casey plays the 
Tuba. They tried out in December 
to get to go in January. Casey was 
6th chair in the concert band. Con-
gratulations! 

Sincere sympathy to family and 
friends of Martha Steen, 66, of 
Porum, Oklahoma, in her death. 
She was the wife of Archie Steen, 
Wesley Steen's brother. 

Glad to hear little McKaylee Swift 

is now home from Amarillo hospi-
tal to Mobeetie. She is doing well 
and eating good. Praise the Lord! 

Ed and Laurel Hershman went 
to Cordell Saturday and ate lunch 
with Emmitt and Carolyn Single-
ton and visited and played domi-
noes. 

Audra's Birthday 
Shea and Bridget Weatherly 

hosted a party for daughter Audra's 
sixth birthday on Sunday Jan. 9. It 
was a nice day, so kids could play 
outside and also played dress-up. 
It was a Strawbe rry Shortcake party 
so they had cup cakes. Happy 
Birthday, Audra. Some there were 
Kaitlyn Walker, Sarah Silva and 
Braxton Maul and friend Monica 
from Pampa, Jhea and Jett 
Weatherly, Savanna Shipp, Am-
ber and Lane Self, Hagen 
Weatherly. Heather Marshall and 
Callie, Sue Chandler, Jamie Click 
and Shelby and Cameron and 
Annie and Yvonne Hernandez. 

Bridgett Weatherly is working at 
Kehon School and helps with the 
reading program. Sue Chandler 
meets her at 9 mile station and 
gets Hagen, 31/2, to keep till after 
school. Audra invited Sue to come 
eat lunch at Kehon Tuesday on 
her birthday. 

Betty Hustead was disappointed 
that her mom, 95, won't be coming 
back to Wheeler and staying in 
Wheeler Care Center. She has 
been in Alaska with a son and 
found a place in a nursing facility 
there in Alaska. The long trip would 
have been hard on her. 

Lou Dean Douthit enjoyed eat-
ing vegetable soup at Peggy arid 
Don North's for supper Saturday 
and had a good visit. Debbie 
Kinnaman also visited Lou Dean 
Saturday. 

Sindy Chapman's mom, Gwen 
Wicks, from Ft. Smith, Arkansas 
came Friday to watch granddaugh- 
ter, Samantha Chapman, play 
basketball at Miami. Wheeler boys 
and girls won both games. Nice to 
have Gwen at Wheeler Baptist 
Church Sunday. She also got to 
hear Samantha sing a beautiful 
special song. James was also 
home from college at Norman, 

Nice to have a letter from 
Annadell (Fillingim) Myers. She 
was looking forward to a visit from 
sisters, Evelyn Free, from Tyler 
and, Violet Farris, from Missouri 
City, Texas, They would visit and 
take a cruise in the Eastern 
Carribean for a week. Anna's son, 
Phillip, and Meredith Dennis plan 
to join them on the ship. She hopes 
their apartment will be finished up 
on the repairing from the hurricane 
damage three months ago, when 
they get back. 

Delores Simmons and Cindy 
Bradstreet prepared a very deli-
cious Wednesday night supper of 
barbequed chicken, mashed po-
tatoes, green beans, tossed salad 
and rolls at Wheeler Baptist. Thank 
you! Others brought delicious des-
serts. 

Hudson Trip 
Ray and Glenda Hudson went 

to Oklahoma City last Thursday, 
January 6, and spent the night. 
Friday morning they flew to New 

(Continued Page 6) 

Old Time Gospel Music 
On KPDR, 90.5 

... In Wheeler 
Sundays 6 a.m. to 8 a.m. 

Pictures are 
needed for this 
advertisement. 
Bring pictures 
by the Times of- 
fice. There is no 
charge. 
Let us watch 
your young- 
sters grow. 

For all your . . . 
Insurance Needs, See 
Eastern Panhandle 
Insur. Agency, Inc. 
117 W. Texas St.—Wheeler 

8061826-3573 
eAtao *Thole *Life *Health 

*Commercial *Bonds 

WHEELER 
MEN 

JENNINGS PLUMBING, HEATING 
& AIR CONDITIONING 

LARRY JENNINGS, Owner 
Dot TAGL13017641E 

a 

EvLaicluensends, Insured & Bonded 

(806) 8264153 
Licensed Septic Systems, & Site 



MESSNER RANCH 

ANNUAL 
HEREFORD & 
ANGUS SALE 

Sat. Feb. 5, 2005-12:30 CST 
Sale held at the ranch, 6 miles 
south, eleven west of Laverne, OK 
SELLING 

25 ANGUS BULLS 
75 HEREFORD BULLS 
32 BRED HEREFORD & 
ANGUS HEIFERS 

VAN MESSNER 
	

PH. 580-837-5532 
RT 2 BOX 68 
	

FAX 5&0-837-5533 

LAVERNE, OK 

e-mail messneraptsimet 

PART-TIME HELP WANTED: 
Janitorial work-Call Terry @ 
845-3101 or 662-2243. 

12/16-1/6p 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC SALE of 
Property to satisfy landlord's lien. 
Sale is 10:00 A.M., January 28, 
2005 at 1107 S. Mobeetie, 
Wheeler, TX. Property will be sold 
to highest bidder for cash. Seller 
reserves right to withdraw prop-
erty from sale. Property includes 
contents for spaces of following 
tenants: Peggy Sperry, Honda 50, 
Saddle, Household Furniture, Goff 
Clubs, Misc. Boxes. Contact Stor 
& Lok, 806-826-3373, P.O. Box 
1136, Wheeler, TX. 	1/13-1/20c 

Weekend RN & Nurse Aide open- 
ings. Wheeler Nursing & Rehab. 
Apply in person. 1000 S. Kiowa. 
See Donna. 	1/13-1/20p 

Wheeler Nursing and Rehab needs 
Housekeeping Supervisor , f lex-
ible hours, competitive pay. Apply 
in person. See Nikki. 1000 S. 
Kiowa. 	 1 /13-1 /20p 

NEEDED: Long Term Care RN-
Director of Nurses for Edward 
Abraham Memorial Home, a med-
icaid certified nursing facility li-
censed for 58 beds. Caring staff, 
great community support. Offer of 
excellent salary, paid holidays, 
vacation and health Insurance. 
Apply at 803 Birch Street, Cana-
dian, or call Catherine at 323-6453. 
EOE. 	 1/13-1/20c 

ATTENTION LANDOWNERS: 
Responsbile Hunters are looking 
for a Deer & Turkey hunting lease. 
Please call: 888-425-3245. 1/13-
1/20p 

NEEDED: Part-time Dispatcher/ 
Jailer. Training provided. Must be 
willing to work all hours, weekends 
and holidays. Contact Wheeler 
County Sheriff's office 826-5537. 
1/20-1/27c 

"Attention Landowners" 
If you have an abandoned 
natural gas pipeline 8" OD or 
larger across your property that 
has been abandoned by a gas 
co. or released in your name, lt 
could be worth a lot of money 
to you for a quick removal pro-
cess and very minimal dam-
age to crop or pasture lands. 
We have removed over 710 
miles of pipeline & have a very 
satisfied landowner list. Please 
call CPI Pipe & Steel, Tyler 
Williams 405-627-2845 or 405-
850-8555. 

- 2 

AUTO GLASS INST ALLAT ION 
BODY REPAIR & 

24-Hr. WRECKER SERVICE 

CROSS 
CAR CENTER 

Phone: 826-5515 
%%IRE :FLIP IFYAS 

HIRING: Wes-Tex Services, Inc., 
a new oilfield service company,,  is 
now hiring qualified Oil Field Driv-
ers. Competitive pay, medical in-
surance, retirement, uniforms, 
safety equipment and incentive 
pay. Contact Tonnie at 101 Caro-
lina, Borger, TX or call Tonnie at 
806-273-2362. 	1/13-2/3C 

Miami Rent Houses: Available 
now. Apply 806-868-6971. Lorene 
Paris. 	 1/13rtn 

HOT-MIX PAVING • SEAL COATING 
PATCHING • REDI-MIX CONCRETE 

"Servng Western Oklahoma & Texas Panhandle" 

DUANE STEVENSON 
	

(580) 243-9442 
Elk City. Oklahoma 
	

(580) 243-2710 

#441101SON PAV Ike  

Find Us Fast 
In The Yellow Pages 

4 
00  

• 

Plains 
The High Plains' 
Plains' new Christian
non-denominational 
featuring the 
places and events. 
per year; $18 
Mail check, M.O. 
info to: Plains 
P.O. Box 52407, 
79159. www.plainsfaith.com 

Introducing 

Faith 
and South 

-based, 
magazine 

region's people, 
Subscribe $10 

for two years. 
or credit card 

Faith Magazine, 
Amarillo, TX 

Magazine 
"i  
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s'i . 	A NEW YEAR FOR OPPORTUNITIES ,-. 
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i 
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- 	11. 

Drive iito the New Year with a new career. Drive for Schneider National. 
• New pay package: company divers earn $4,000 more per year, 

owner operators recieve 5.90 per mde (loaded and empty) 
• No experience nar•Pc-sary 
• Company-paid CDL traini-ig for qualified candidates 
• S34,500442,500 1st year (inexperienced) 
• $48,500-$57,500/year iri 4 years 
• low-cost medical & dental insurance; free vision & He 
• Sobs & teams 
• 50%400% company-matched 4010) 
• Pad vacation & hoOdays 

learns Batt $7,000 more per year than solo drivers 
Apply Online 0 vonvechnelderjoba.com 

,a 	 or call 
- 	1400-44-PRIDE • (1-800-447-7433) 

Mon-Fri lam-9pin. Sat & Sun: gam-flpm Cannot Diem 

SCHigIDER, 
111/17.11ThlThifil 

has been linked to heart 
attacks and strokes. 
If you or a loved one has suffered 
a heart attack or stroke which 
may be linked to Vio)ce, call 

NO FEE FOR 
FIRST VISIT 

Ryan A. Krebs, M.D., J.D. 
Doctor -Lawyer in Full-tune Law Practice 

Richard A. Dodd, L.C. 

Craig W. Brown, PL.L.C. 
Timothy R. Cappolino, P.C. 
Board Certthed Pelona( trona tea ira 018 

Ttial Lab, the Tan Bead at Lesal Speak: Moo 
Cameron, TX 

us for professional insight 
CAPPOU.10 is CERTIFIED NS ABOvE,OTHERS NOT CERT1FLF_D 

BY Ti* TEXAS BOARD OF LEON_ SPECUNIZATK:N. 

1-800-460-0606 
WW W.(I e feet i Ve LI  r u gs I aw.com 

DRIVERS  What Are YOU Driving Toward? 
Company Drivers, lease & Owner Operators! 

it 	START UP TO 37C/Mile & 85C/Mile! 
Pr, • XM Radio/CD Stereo! 
Pr• Fuel & Performance Bonuses 
pl.• Layover/Load/Unload Pay 
0.10.• Weekly Paydays p.• Paid Vacation 

Need Class "A"CDL 	
.4clitrandsv 

CAL s 800-745-9670 tarrire 
www.continentalx.com 

CEL 	BREX
Heart Attacks, 

Strokes & Sudden 
VIOXX •  BEXTRA • • Naproxen Cardiac Deaths 
kaartiviani..a•disminnitioblitatidia 
art ma mists SY= eastAneara nem mom, WILLIS LAW FIRM-HOUSTON, TEXAS 
Clan II lealte. bolb Ca 2 Sin SS le VOX Nee 
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Call Toll Free 1-800-468-4878 

BOARD CERTIFIED 
PERSONAL INJURY TRIAL LAWYER 

Tarn Board of Legal Specialization 

Toll Free 1-800-883-9858 
www.VioxxRccall.com 
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Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post Office at 
Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879. 

Postmaster: Send Address changes to The Wheeler 
Times, P.O. Box 1080, Wheeler, TX 79096-1080 

Louis C. Stas, Owner & Publisher 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 

Wheeler County...$20.00 - Outside County... $22.00 
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• 

urgent news for people who took 

CELEBREX. 
VIOXX. BEXTRA. 
Many VIOXX. and CELEBREJC. users suffered strokes, heart 
attacks, blood clots and even death. If you took BEJETRAa you 
might also have been at risk for a serious cardiovascular health 
problem. If you or a loved one had any of these problems, call 
us now toll free at 1-800-THE-EAGLE for a tree consultation. 
We practice law only In Arizona but associate with lawyers 
throughout the U.S. 

GOLDBERG & OSBORNE 
1-800-THE-EAGLE 
(1-800-843-3245) 

www. 1800theea le.com 
°tors ln 
rest:nal • 
Tucson 

„le*  

OR STRUCTURED SETTLEIVI 
4'4' ANNUITIES and INSURANCE/A 0 

(800) 794-73 
J.G. Wentworth means CAS 

for Structured Settlements! 

   

AUCTION 
Foreclosed I tomes 

 

  

January 24th-26th, 2005 

 

15+/- Homes across 
Texas. 

For dates, details, terms and conditions, go to 

wvvw.rogersrealty.corn 
TXAI 

336-789-2926 	Erne  932" ROGERS 

• 

Statewide Ad ..... 	$400 
A Newspapers, l.I Million Circuialice 

North Region Only 	$175 
IO2 Newspapers, 381,000 Circulation 

South Region Only 	$175 
101 Newspapers, 16241.10 eirealation 

West Region Only 	• $175 
103 Newspapers, Nice Crculgian 

To Order Call This Newspaper 
direct, or call Texas Press Service 

at1-800-749-4793Today! 

TEXAS STATEWIDE CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING NETWORK 

	

Owner/Operators - home weekly, 	 CAL STRENGTH ALTERNA- 
pay increases in January and FREE 4-ROOM DIRECFV system TIVE. (30 blue 100mg tabs 
March. Class A/CDL with HazMat includes standard installation! 3 $89.95). No prescription 'needed. 
and one year experience required. 
Arnold Transportation. Call today! months FREE HBO and Cineplex! FREE SHIPPING! (•Viegrads a 

	

MI CASH COW!! 90 vending DRIVER  „ COVENANT 	

mited registered 

time offer S&H. Restrictions apply. Call P. E. Labs. 1 
trademark of Pfizer Co.) 

488-527•0870. 
1-877-242-0972. 	 Access to over 225 channels! Li  

machines in 30 locations - $10,670. www.BLUEPILLUSAtOK '  
TRANSPORT. Excellent pay 1-800-264-3458i 

Call nowl 	1-800-836-3464. and benefits for experienced driv- 
1.800. VENDING. SAWMILLS  -  $2,695.00 •LUM- 

en. Owner/Operators, solos, teams BERMATE•2000 and Lumber- 292.65 ACRES, ROLLING West 

	

and graduate students. Bonuses 	 Texas with good draw at end- of 
Equal Opportunity Lite-24. Norwood Industries also road. Mule deer, blue quail, dove, $4.000 SIGN-ON. Otte year OTR Paid weekly. 

2nd paycheck, $500 after 10.000 (1-
888-667-3729). 	 ments. log skidders, portable board with 5% down. 1-830-885-4578. 

100.000! 
DRIVERS START A.S.A.P. edgers and forestry equipment. www,rancheejetiosesijd_com  , 

miles then .03 cpm for 
Call anytime? 1-800-569-9232, Regional and OTR. Experi- www.norwoodindustries.com. 

Con well Corp. 	  cooed and recent school gradu- Fret 
information:1400-578-1363. 

STEEL ARCH BUILDINGS! 
Genuine SteelMaster® Build-
ings, factory direct at -HUGH 
SAVINGS! 20X24, ' 30r60, 

nee e . Flatbed-refrigerated  

	

drivers Top pay!! Truck Driver 	
35X50. Perfect garage/workshop/ 

- tanker. Over-the-road, some 	 EARN YOUR DEGREE online barn. Call 1-800-341-7007. 
Placement, 1-800-291-0412. regional. Commercial Driver's 	  

License training. 1-800-771-6318, DRIVERS - TANK CARRIER from home. Business, paralegal. www.SteelMasterUSA.com 
www.primeinc.com 	

 seeking professional Owner/ computers. networking and more. 
Financial aid available, job place- 

CFIHIRING OTRcompany driven Operators and Company drivers ment assistance and computers WOLFF TANNING • EPS. 

Solos and teams apply today! Now today for all the details. Quality 1466-858-2121. 
provided. Call free, Tidewater Tech, home. Payments from 529/pattah. 

Affordable, convenient" Tin at 
and Owner/CI:cram. COL required! with Haz and tank endorse Call 

providing XM Satellite Radio! I- 	
. FREE color 	Call  tbday. 

Carriers. 1-877-967-5472. mini- 
800-CFT-DRIVE (1-800-234-3748) 	 . 	 NOW HIRING 2005. Postal 

MUM one year experience. 
or www.cfidrive.com 	 positions. Federal. state and local. 

EMPLOYMENT 
OPPORTUNITY 

TexSCAN Week of 
January 16, 2005 

DRIVERS, COMPANY AND 	 •VIAGRA• PHARMACEUTI- FOR SALE 

BUSINESS 
OPPORTUNITY 

REAL ESTATE 

DRIVERS WANTED 

Employer.  can 1-888-MORE PAY manufactures utility ATV attach- javelin. $165/acre, owner financed experience/Class A/CDL. $500 on 

STEEL BUILDINGS 

ADVANCE YOUR DRIVING aces. Company drivers, teams. 
Ext. 300N. 

 
career! Increase in pay pack- Owner/Operators. 	$1,000 
age Contractors and company sign-on bonus for experienced 

INSTRUCTION & 
TRAINING 

TANNING BEDS 

DRIVERS/A/CDL FLAT- 
BED DRIVERS, $50,000 

ence. SMX, 1-800.247-8040, career Aviation 
miles, one year T/T experi- 

Y AIRLINE MECHANIC - efits. Paid training. Call 7 days yearly potential. High weekly  
gonformashiinghtenpaanyicneg Efoxrt.4o2.  information, 1-888-826-2513, 

$14.80/548+/hour. No experience 
necessary. Entry levels. Full ben- 

www.smxc.com 	 FAA predicts severe shortage. 

DRIVERS- BANK ON IT! Financial aid, job placement 

All the miles you want! Many 
assistance, 1-888-349-5387. • DIET 	PILLS* 	PHENT- 

regional run options, new big 
pay increases. Low cost CDL 
training. Swift Transportation, (B-I-B) BUSINESS IS BOOMING 

needed. 	FREE SHIPPING!  

I -800-231.5209, www.SwiftTr (Real Estate) and I need your help! 
Call P.E. Labs, 1488-527-0870,  

uckingJobs.com 	 Call I-8138-231-8248. 	
www.BLUEPILLUSA.COM 

MISCELLANEOUS 

NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, contact 
the Texas Attorney General at I-800-621-0508 or the Federal Track Commission at I-877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bi 

Extend your advertising reach with TexSCAN, your Statewide Classified Ad Network. 

re 
VIVEr.  

	

11n1WW 	 Sel1 
alaiallo 	la 1 	 a V

- - - 
	a 

I 
a a 	a a a 

SS air de all 	a - 
Le a a a ann 

a , In 
1111-lartiar✓1111.11t. AI a. 	if mir w 	 a. a  Jl a. 

'a V 
AK 1 
as a 

AI a a a a 
0 

 
- 	1 a I 

is 
 

Run Your Ad In TexSCAN! 

EMPLOYMENT/SALES 
RAZINE 37.5 (60 blue white 
tabs $89.95). No prescriptiiin 

NEEDED: Wheeler Nursing & 
Rehab. nurse aide positions open. 
Will certify. Contact Donna Cox, 
RN DON, 1000 S. Kiowa. 	11/ 
18rtn 

Oil S Gas 
NEWS 

(New Location, Completion and 
Plugging Report made possible 
by Oil & Gas Reporting Service, 
3930 Beaver St., Vernon, TX 
76384.. Doris Harrison, Phone: 
940/552-6644,) 
Week Ending January 13, 2005 
Intentions to Drill  
ROBERTS (WILDCAT & ALPAR-
PEARSON Brown Dolomite) 
Jones Energy, Ltd., #3 
McGarraugh, 1850' from E/South 
line & 330' from S/West line, Sec. 
14,44, E.C. Hooper, PD 4000' 
(BHL: 467' from E/South & S/East 
Sec. line) Horizontal 
WHEELER (WILDCAT & MO-TEX 
Meisner) Texakoma E&P, L.L.C., 
#1 Texakoma Mo-Tex '16', 1780' 
from South & 1980' from East line, 
Sec. 16,A-5,H&CN, PD 13500'. 
WHEELER (WILDCAT & STILES 
RANCH Granite Wash) Chesa-
peake Operating, Inc., #2020 
Armstrong, 990'f rom North & 1650' 
from East line, Sec. 20,A-3,H&GN, 
PD 16000'. 
WHEELER (WILDCAT & STILES 
RANCH Granite Wash) Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Con., Inc., #3 Britt 
Ranch F '6', 660' from South & 
1980' from West line, Sec. 
6,2,B&B, PD 15850'. 
WHEELER (WILDCAT & STILES 
RANCH Granite Wash) Newfield 
Exploration Mid-Con., Inc., #9 Britt 
Ranch C '35', 2640' from North & 
467' from West line, Sec. 35,A-
3,H&GN, PD 15850'. 
Application to Plug-Back  
ROBERTS (NORTH MATHERS 
Upper Morrow) Range Production 
Co., #2 Pioneer, 1430' from North 
& 1047' from West line, Sec. 
31,43,H&TC, PD 11500'. 
Gas Well Completions  
HEMPHILL (BUFFALO WALLOW 
Granite Wash) Kaiser-Francis Oil 
Co., #10 Fillingim-Teas '87', Sec. 
87,M-1,H&GN, spud 10-5-04, drlg. 
compl 10-22-04, tested 11-29-04, 
potential 1011 MCF, TD 11800', 
PBTD 11778' -- 
HEMPHILL (N.W. MENDOTA Up-
per Morrow) Unit Petroleum Co., 
#3 Vollmert 'C', Sec. 10,--,BS&F, 
spud 8-29-04, drlg. compl 10-30- 

FOR SALE: 3 Bedroom Brick 
Home, 2 Bath, 2 Car Garage, Horse 
Shed and Corral. From 10 to 60 
acres of land Southwest edge of 
Wheeler/Deer, Turkey & Quail. 
Phone: 826-5965. 	12/30-1/20p 

HELP WANTED: Parkview Dietary 
Dept. needs parttime cook/tray 
aide. Apply in person. Call 826-
5581 for appointment. 10/28-rtn 

Wheeler County 
COURT RECORDS 

List of Instruments filed In the 
Wheeler County Clerk's Office 
from December 30, 2004 -Janu-
ary 6, 2005. 
DECEMBER 30, 2004 
OL-Ernest E. Henderson (Life 
Estate) to Sanguine Gas Explora-
tion LLC, 11-1-04, N 1/2 N 1/2 Sec. 
14, Blk. A-7, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
OL-Giesman Living Trust to San-
guine Gas Exploration LLC, 11-1-
04, N 1/2 N 1/2 Sec. 14, Blk. A-7, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
OL-Ernest E. Henderson (Life 
Estate) to Sanguine Gas Explora-
tion LLC, 11-1-04, W 400 acs.; S/ 
3 E 240 acs. Sec. 27, Blk. A-7, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
OL-Giesman Living Trust to San-
guine Gas Exploration LLC, 11-1-
04, W 400 acs.; S/3 E 240 acs. 
Sec. 27, Blk. A-7, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
OL-Matt D. Moore to Sanguine 
Gas Exploration LLC, 11-1-04, N 
60 acs. E 240 acs. Sec. 27, Blk. A-
7, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
OL-James R. Henderson to San-
guine Gas Exploration LLC, 11-
24-04, E 1/2; SW 1/4 Sec. 28, Blk.  
A-7, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
OL-J. D. Henderson to Sanguine 
Gas Exploration LLC, 11-24-04, E 
1/2; SW 1/4 Sec. 28, Blk. A-7, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
RDT-Washington Mutual Bank, 
FA to Keith Rose, et ux, 12-17-04, 
See Instrument. 
ASSIGN.-Green River Explora-
tion Company to Kaiser-Francis 
Mid-Continent Limited Partnership, 
12-15-04, See Instrument. 
OL-Mitzi Jones Coukoulis to Jess 
Harris III, 10-26-04, W 1/2 NE 1/4 
Sec. 46, Blk. A-7, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR COMMERCIAL 
DISPOSAL WELL 
PERMIT IN A NON 

PRODUCTIVE FORMATION 
SLT Dakota Operating, Inc., P.O. 
Box 967, Borger, TX. 79008 is 
applying to the Railroad Commis-
sion of Texas fora COMMERCIAL 
DISPOSAL WELL PERMITto dis-
pose of produced salt water or 
other oil and gas waste by well 
injection into a porous formation 
not productive of oil or gas. 
The applicant proposes to dispose 
of oil and gas waste into the Brown 
Dolomite formation Sandman 
(197905) Lease, Well Number 1. 
The proposed injection well is lo-
cated 2 miles West of Mobeetie, 
Texas in the Allen-Engler (Brown 
Dolomite) Field, in Wheeler 
County. Fluid waste will be injected 
into strata in the subsurface depth 
interval from 4116 to 4178 feet. 
LEGAL AUTHORITY: Chapter 27 
of the Texas Water Code, as 
amended, Title 3 of the Texas Natu-
ral Resources Code, as amended, 
and the Statewide Rules of the Oil 
and Gas Division of the Railroad 
Commission of Texas. 
Requests for a public hearing from 
persons who can show they are 
adversely affected or requests for 
further information concerning any 
aspect of the applications should 
be submitted in writing, within fif-
teen days of publication, to the 
Environmental Services Section, 
Oil and Gas Division, Railroad 
Commission of Texas, P.O. Box 
12967, Austin, Texas78711 (Tele- 
phone 512-463-6792). 	1/20c 

FOR SALE: 8' complete windmill 
head. $850.00. Call 806-662-3894. 
1/20-2/10c 

Listen to . . . 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
WHEELER, TEXAS 

ASSIGN.-Continental Land Re-
sources LLC to Dominion Okla-
homa Texas Exploration & Pro-
duction Inc., 12-2-04, Sec. 15, Blk. 
R.E., Roberts & Eddelman Sur-
vey. 
ASSIGN.-Continental Land Re-
sources LLC to Dominion Okla-
homa Texas Exploration & Pro-
duction Inc., 12-2-04, Sec. 39, Blk. 
A-3, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
ASSIGN. JU DGMENT-Providian 
National bank to Sherman Acqui-
sition LP, 11-14-04. 
MD-Sidney W. Mills Living Trust 
to Brett R. Mills, et al, 12-28-04, 
See Instrument. 
OL-Carol O'Connor to Samson 
Lone Star Limited Partnership, 10-
14-04, Sec. 39, Blk. A-3, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
OL-Lucille M. Peterson to 
Samson Lone Star Limited Part-
nership, 10-14-04, Sec. 39, Blk. A-
3, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
POA-Jack Hanna Lisleto Bonnie 
Mae Davidson, et al, 12-30-04, 
See Instrument. 
D-Jack Hanna Lisle to Bonnie 
Mae Davidson, et al, 12-30-04, NE 
1/4; E 1/2 E 1/2 NW 1/4 Sec. 55, 
Blk. 17, H&GN Ry. Company Sur-
vey. 
CORR. SHERIFF'S D-Estie 
Rogers (Estate), et al to James H. 
Hill, et ux, 12-30-04, N 40' S 100' E 
1/2 Blk. 44, Stanley Add., Wheeler. 
D-Dennis Austin Ward, et ux to 
Mark D. Evatt, et ux, 12-30-04, 
Lots 7-9, Blk. 19, Shamrock. 
MD-Evelyn Meek Trust to Evelyn 
Vise Meek, 3-10-04, NW 1/4 Sec. 
60, Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey; and S 1/2 Sec. 59, Blk. A-
8, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
MD-Evelyn Vise Meek to Mark S. 
Meek, et al, 3-10-04, NW 1/4 Sec. 
60, Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey; S 1/2 Sec. 59, Blk. A-8, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
RDT-United States of America-
Rural Housing Service to Shelley 
M. Hudgins, 11-30-04, See Instru-
ment. 
JANUARY 3, 2005 
A. of JUDG.-Midway Truck & 
Travel to Krista Patton, 12-28-04. 
PARTIAL TDT-National Bank of 
Commerce to Maverick Residen-
tial Mortgage Inc., 12-30-04, 5 acs. 
Sec. 10, Blk. 24, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
AFF.-Bobbye C. Hill to Larry Don 
Henry, et al, 12-30-04, SW 1/4 
Sec. 11; SW 1/4 Sec. 13, Blk. A-7, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey; NE 
1/4 Sec. 6, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
REL STL-State of Texas to 
Enbridge Pipelines (Texas Gath-
ering) LP, 12-20-04. 
REL STL-State of Texas to 
Enbridge Pipelines (Texas Gath-
ering) LP, 12-20-04. 
REL STL-State of Texas to 
Enbridge Pipelines (Texas Gath-
ering) LP, 12-20-04. 
AFF. CLAIMING LIEN-ATR 
Roofing to Neil Todd, 12-17-04, All 
of Lots 3 and 4, S 20' Lot 5, W 56' 
Lot 18, all of Lots 19 and 20, Blk. 
203, Vaughan's Hilltop Add., 
Shamrock. 
MEMORANDUM OPTION 
AGREE.-Zachary Adam Shatter 
to Brigham Oil & Gas LP, 12-5-04, 
N 160 acs. Sec. 33, Blk. A-7, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
MEMORANDUM OPTION 
AGREE.-Bryan Matthew Shaffer 
to Brigham Oil & Gas LP, 12-5-04, 
M 160 acs. Sec. 33, BIk. A-7, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
ROY./MD/ASSIGN./CONVEY.-
Kathryn B. Neilerto Kelly H. Baxter, 
12-16-04, Sec. 49, BIk. A-7, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey; Sec. 2, D. 
Tindale Survey. 
OL-Shawn S. Scholl to Brigham 
Oil & Gas LP, 11-22-04, SW 1/4 
Sec. 96, Blk. 13, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey, 
EXT. OL-Shawn S. Scholl to 
Brigham Oil & Gas LP, 11-29-04, 
NW 1/4 Sec. 96, Blk. 13, H&GN 

(Continued Page 5) 

It pays to Advertise in 
The Wheeler Times 

826-3123 - yrtimesZcentnimedinnel  

Classified. 
Cash-$4.03 for first 20 words 

Charge-$6.00 for first 20 words 
15c tor each additional word 
Open Rate: $2.50 Per Col In.  

Card of Thanks$5 00 

	 - 

HELP WANTED: Must be willing 
to cook, run cash register and lot- 
tery. Apply in person at Speedi 
Man. 	 8/5rtn 

HELP NEEDED: Taking applica- 
tions for full time secretary. Oil and 
Gas experience preferred. Phone: 
826-3516. 	 11/18rtn 

FOR SALE: Seasoned Oak Fire-
wood. Delivered & Stacked. 779- 
3284. 	 11/4rtn 
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GREAT PLAIN  S 
REGIONAL MEDICAL CENTER 

welcomes 

JOHN H. TRUE, M.D. 
Orthopedic Surgeon 

to our medical staff 
1111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111W7  

 

1111111111. 

 

   

The office of John H. True, M.D., is now open for appointments at Great 
Plains Regional Medical Center. Board certified in orthopedic surgery by 
the American Board of Orthopaedic Surgery and a member of the American 
Academy of Orthopaedic Surgeons, Dr. True comes to Elk City from 
Whitefish, Montana. 

His skill and experience in the treatment of sports injuries, hand and foot 
problems, shoulder, neck and back, and the full range of joint replacement. 
is a welcome addition to our medical staff expertise. 

Help us in welcoming Dr. True to Elk City and Western Oklahoma. 

OFFICE HOURS 
9:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday 

Physicians Office Building 
1800 West lst Street, Suite 107B 

580/225-9988 Phone 
580/225-6885 Fax 

r 

'Allison 	(from Page 1) 

enjoyed some delicious appetiz-
ers at Maxey's, as not to ruin our 
meal later on at Reydon, Okla-
homa. They had a good time shop-
ping and being together. 

Kim, Kimber, Brittany and Chase 
Thompson of Amarillo, Texas jour-
neyed to Allison and visited and 
stayed in the home of Louise 
Boydston. 

Sunday dinner guests in the 
home of Louise Boydston were: 
Pearl Harrison, Kim, Kimber, Brit-
tany and Chase Thompson, Opal 
and Juanita Boydston, Sabrina and 
Cody Dupont, and Eddy Walker. 

Louise Boydston journeyed to 
Amarillo, Texas on Monday where 
she stayed in the home of Chuck 
and Kim Thompson, Kimber, Brit-
tany and Chase. Louise met Virgil 
and Jean Stinnett of Dumas, Texas 
at the hospital where Virgil Stinnett 
was having some test done. They 
found blockage in both legs. We 
are praying for his healing. 

a  Gary and Julie Boydston and 
W grandson, Ryne Purcell. were sup-

per guests in the home of Pearl 
Harrison. 

Friday, Gary Boydston and 
Bennie Boydston were dinner 
guests in the home of Pearl 
Harrison. 

• Pearl Harrison visited in her 
daughters, Louise Boydston's, 
home on Saturday. 

Pearl reported a call from her 
brother, Elmer Lee Sanford. Said 
they had a nice visit. 

Weekend visitors in the home of 
Gary and Julie Boydston were 
Doug, Amie and Ryne Purcell of 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma, Ton 
and Hannah Boydston of Stinnett, 
Texas and Greg, Tiffanye, Kaylye 
and Gavin Boydston of Amarillo, 
Texas. 

On Saturday, Julie, Doug, Amie 
and Ryne attended Brady Bailey's 
3rd birthday party in Wheeler, 
Texas. 

God Bless and Keep ya'll till 
next week!! 

Notes from Vance's wife: 
The beautiful iced over wonder- 

& land we had a few days ago really 
made me homesick. In Indiana 
where I grew up and lived most of 
my life until 1979, we had beautiful 
snows. Many times in January the 
schools would be closed and the 
streets were impassible. That 

a made for a good family time! We 
w bundled up til we could hardly 

breathe and out came the sled. 
Marsha and Linda would take turns 
pulling the little ones, Melissa and 
Michael all around the neighbor-
hood. Then they would all work 
together to build a gigantic 
snowman and after he had his hat 
and carrot nose he would need a 
wife and next some kids and of 
course it takes a dog to complete 
the family. Marsha could build a 
great snoopy! 

By then some neighborhood kids 
would start drifting over and help 
build an igloo and forts and always 
there would be the snowball fights. 
What fun! My favorite thing was to 
make lots of snow angels! Well 
maybe there was one other thing I 
liked better. Because when we 

1) were all about frozen and tired out, 
in we would go. Dry all and change 
and have some hot homemade 
chocolate with marshmallows. 
Yummy! Yummy!! for the tummy! 
When we were all warm and toasty 
and telling stories. I'd skip out back 
and find some deep white snow, a   

▪ that had not been yellowed and 
take in a pan full to make snow ice 
cream! That was my favorite thing 
to do. We all loved it. That was 
some of my dreams of yesterday. 
Yes, those were good ole days in 
Indiana, when my children were 
growing up. Happy memories! 

Now today, my wonderful good 
days are spent in Allison, Texas 
with Vance! Only God could have 
brought me such a wonderful hus-
band. My advice to the young and 
old alike is: "Let God do it". He is a 
perfectionist. I owe him everything! 

Palace Theatre 
210 Main • Canadian 

(806) 323-5133 
www.palacetheatre.com 

Starting Friday, Jan.21: 

"SPANG LISH" 
Rated PG-13 

Showtime: 
Fri. thru Thurs. 	 7:00 P.M. 
Sunday Matinee 	 2:00 P.M. 

TRADIO 
On KPDR, 90.5 

... in Wheeler 
Weekdays at 7:55 •  

PLUMBING 
511 S. Cheyenn,e 

• New Construction 
Remodel 
Repair 

Sewer Service 
Septic Systems 

• Site Evaluations 

Phone: 826-5907 
MAX McQUEEN 

P.O.Box 754 Wheeler, 
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A week or so ago we skipped 
town. That's Vance and Carol. The 
plan had been to go to Oklahoma 
City, Oklahoma and visit Curtis 
and Lil and take in a revival (3 day) 
at Southern Oaks. That's when 
Mother Nature changed our plans. 
The ice came, the electricity was 
gone. The old gray goose was 
iced in and the doors wouldn't even 
open and there was no heat at our 
house, so we just crawled back in 
bed and kept warm. Retirement 
gives you so much freedom. Keep 
on working hard and before you 
know it, you'll be living the good 
life! Senior discounts and all. Hur-
rah, the lights came back on, the 
home was warm again and an 
aroma of hot food again! We sure 
did thank the Lord and asked him 
to bless the faithful workers who 
get right out and brave the cold to 
help us to be comfortable. 

On Friday, we were finally on 
our way to Oklahoma City. Hip, 
Hip, Hoorah! Got there just in time 
to hear a wonderful sermon by the 
annointed vibrant Rev. Daniel 
Lewis of Call, Texas. Aren't we as 
humans, a little questionable in 
what we do sometimes? Like trav-
eling from Texas to Oklahoma to 
hear a Texas speaker. 

Of course there was more to our 
trip. After service, we attended a 
fun time party in honor of our beau-
tiful talented granddaughter, 
Anthea, six years old already. The 
family gathered around her and 
sang and she blew out all of her 
candles, but didn't share her spe-
cial wish with us! Wonder what a 
six year old wishes for? I should 
remember, Its only been sixty-two 
years ago. Anthea graciously 
thanked everyone for coming and 
expressed how much she liked all 
her gifts. She was especially inter-
ested in a learning computer from 
Poppy Dale. She gave us a mini 
concert on the piano. Little sister, 
Eliza, tried to steal the show by 
trading dolls with Anthea and put-
ting on her tiara, her backpack and 
wristwatch and dancing around 
like they were her own. Then the 
three year old announced "I al-
ready had my birthday and this 
one is my sissy's." 

Next morning, Vance and Carol 
found their way to Tecumceh, 
Oklahoma. There Vance picked 
up his permanment teeth! Yes, it's 
not just that he's so handsome and 
looks ten years younger, but he 
can eat real food again. Wonder 
how long it will take him to gain 
back the forty pounds he lost? 
Maybe he won't because he said 
they pulled his sweet tooth and I 
believe it! He was sugar every-
thing now he sometimes doesn't 
even leave room for dessert. Time 
will tell. 

Saturday afternoon, we found 
ourselves back at Southern Oaks 
U.P.C. where our friends, Glen 
and Bobby Watson listened to Bro. 
Whalen and Bro. Parker, as they 
renewed their vows afterfifty years 
of marriage. Celden bliss! Too few 
reach this time these days. They 
were honored by many friends and 
relatives in the fellowship hall for a 
beautiful and delicious reception. 
Slides were delightfully enjoyed 
by all, as the couple's life from 
when they were young and had 
their family. Right up to the day it 
was displayed. It was a great way 
to share their happiness. 

The day didn't end there. Vance 
and Carol were on the road once 
more heading east on highway 40 
and north on highway 75 at 
Henrietta. On to the home of their 
son, Kevin. There, Kevin and 
Theda had planned a real blowout 
for four year old Chelsi. Papa 
Vance's pride and joy! Even thoug h 
he has many now, Chelsi was his 
and Caroline's very first grand-
daughter and beautiful as she is, 
she will always have that special 
place in Papa's heart. 

Chelsi's birthday party was well 
underway when we arrived. She 
had many friends traveling back 
and forth from her playroom to the 
kitchen and an occasional stop by 
the bathroom. And most of their 
parents were eating and having a 
great time. And there were two 
proud and loving grandparents, 
Theda's parents, Carolyn and Ted 
Beasley, with little Adria the new-
est beauty added to the home. 
With all of this, Chelsi was anx-
iously awaiting the arrival of Papa 
Vance and Grammy Carol. Papa 
and Grammy were excited too as 
they finally arrived! Busy Chelsi 
found time every now and then to 
run to Papa Vance who was al-
ways ready for her attention! And 
Grammy Carol ever so happy hold-
ing little Adria until she needed 
changing and then she was turned 
overto Papa Vance. Daddy, Kevin 
informed us his Dad hadn't lost his 
touch since he first changed Chelsi. 
And of course he got his practice 
years ago with those special sons, 
first Kevin and then Kyle. Nowa-
days, he often brags of his three 
sons and three daughters and tons 
of grandchildren and even some 
greats! 

Chelsi received many gifts and 
hugs and had a beautiful Barbie 
Cake. When all had been hugged 
and thanked and left for home 
except for Papa Vance and 
Grammy Carol everything settled 
down quite a bit. Momma, Theda, 
found a moment to breathe after 
such a busy day and she held her 
sweet baby, Adria, close to her for 
a little while. What joy. Chelsi was 
keeping Daddy and Papa enter-
tained with her new Cootee Bag 
Game. Calling their expertise to 
take the parts all apart and put on 
the peg board and then to play a 
game. Charming Chelsi enter-
tained us with her Terrie - Okie 
machine. She has a beautiful voice. 
It had been a very busy day for all 
of us so we retired for the evening. 
I, so enjoyed kissing sweet Chelsi 
goodnight and tucking her into bed 
and assuring her we would still be  

with her when morning comes. We 
slept well, so happy to be with our 
kids. 

Morning came. All were rushing 
around eating hot biscuits, rolls 
and other food. Kevin and Theda 
had to be at church early to prac-
tice singing. They all dressed up 
so pretty. It was a special day for 
baby Adria! Both sets of grandpar-
ents there for her dedication to 
Jesus. We felt so blessed to be 
able to be there and be a part of 
her most important day! We all 
celebrated with a lovely dinner and 
fellowship at AppleBees. Then we 
said goodbye and headed back to 
Oklahoma City where we attended 
service and heard avery annointed 
message from God through, Bro. 
Parker. Love should be the main 
drive in life and God is love! 

Later, we enjoyed a good ole 
game of spinners with Curtis and 
Lil. Theirs is the very best "Bed 
and Breakfast" in Oklahoma City. 
Don't tell them we told, Ok? We 
really miss them when they are 
gone from Allison. 

Sometime, we squeezed in a 
visit with Aunt Anna and cousin 
Belvadene Buol in Norman. We 
enjoyed being with them. Gave 
Vance a chance to catch a quick 
nap while we girls chatted. And we 
also stopped by the home of a 
dear friend, Professor Jame: 
Hamilton Abbott, Alius Kevii 
James. What a wonderful time WE 

always have visiting him. He is a 
retired spanish teacher from Okla-
homa University. He grew up in 
Florida and has spent many sum-
mers in Spain. He is a simple won-
derful man. We sang for him and 
he was delighted! It is our hope to 
take him back to visit his home in 
Florida in the spring. We pray his 
health will be so he can make the 
trip. It would be a great blessing for 
his later years. We find him such a 
loving and wonderful man! What a 
waste that he has never married. 
He would have been such a loving 
husband and father. His friend-
ship blesses us. As we were leav-
ing we had to take with us one of 
his famous little fruit cakes which 
he personally prepares and bakes 
for his friends each Christmas sea-
son. 

We picked up five old scrappy 
chairs from our Norman home and 
delivered them to our friends, Bill 
and Jean Merchant. They will make 
them beautiful for us and we plan 
to use them in our dining room. 

Time to head back to Allison 
Home Sweet Home. Arrived just in 
time for Tuesday night service at 
the Allison United Pentecostal 
Church. Brother McDaniel still has 
it. He brings us some really uplift-
ing messages. 

It is always good to be back 
home. Several of us enjoyed ar 
abundantly good meal at the Se-
nior Cizizen's at Reydon, Okla-
homa Friday evening. Nelda Dukes 
and Juanita Boydston accompa-
nied us.  over there. We really en-
joyed their company. This Thurs-
day there is going to be another 
meal served at Reydon, Oklahoma 
Senior Citizen's Building from 4 to 
6:30 p.m. Seniors pay $3.00 there 
or $3.50 to go. Fifty-five and under  

pay $5.00 there and $5.50 to go. It 
is always delicious meals and well 
worth the cost and drive. Its all 
volunteer workers. They do a su-
perb job. This time it will be fried 
chicken and the works. Dessert 
and tea, coffee or water is included. 
You all come if you can! Help sup-
port activities in our communities! 

Guess that's about it for Vance 
and Carol this time. We have en-
joyed spinners with Mom and 
Juanita and Glenn and Betty since 
we've been back. Louise has been 
too busy with her own doings but 
we did get to visit her and Pearl 
and enjoyed some popcorn and 
peach cobbler one evening and 
enjoyed some good music from 
Louisana Camp meeting. 

We've got to get around and see 
our new g re at-niece, Adri anna. Got 
to find out when's a good time for 
those proud parents, Robert and 
Jamie Goldsberg. There will be a 
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Ry. Company Survey. 
ROW-Coy L. Bartz to Enogex 
Gas Gathering LLC, 12-11-04, Pt. 
SW 1/4 Sec. 19, Blk. A-3, H&GN 
Ry, Company Survey. 
D-Melvin Ray Coate to Ann M. 
Cook (Anna Mae), 12-28-04, Lot 
4, Blk. 2, Vise Sub. Div., Wheeler. 
DVL- Ann M. Cook (Anna Mae) 
to Valeetah Mayfield, 1-3-05, Lot 
4, Blk. 2, Vise Sub. Div., Wheeler. 
DT-Valeetah Mayfield to Ann M. 
Cook (Anna Mae), 1-3-05, Lot 4, 
Blk. 2, Vise Sub. Div., Wheeler. 
JANUARY 4, 2005 
D-Valdemar Johnny Velasquez, 
et ux to D & R Transports, 1-4-05, 
Pt. Sec. 5, Blk. A-4, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. ') 
MD-Betty Standlee Zybach to 
Mark R. Zybach, et al, 1-3-05, W 1/ 
2 Sec. 65 and 33.32 acs. W 1/2 
Sec. 66, Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
0-Michael Hibler, et ux to 
Eliberardo Venzor, et al, 12-30- 
4, 92' x 140' N 1/2 NW 1/4 Sec. 
60, 81k. A-8, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
ROW-Sam D. Pakan to Questa 
Energy Corporation, 12-15-04, SE 
1/4 Sec. 111, Blk. 23, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
ASSIGN. OVERRID. ROYALTY-
Texakoma Exploration & Produc-
tion LLC to Scott J. Taylor, et al, 
12-20-04, Sec. 82, Blk. A-5, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
ASSIGN.-Parlay Corporation to 
Texakoma Exploration & Produc-
tion LLC, 12-2-04, Sec. 82, Blk. A- 
5, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
DT-Toreador Exploration & Pro-
duction Inc., et al to Texas Capital 
Bank NA, 12-30-04, See Instru-
ment. 
OWNERSHIP APPLICATION-
Oak Creek Homes to Brock 
Crockett, et ux, 12-21-04, 5 acs. 
Sec. 10, Blk. 24, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
ASSIGN./B of SALE-Mark A. 
Chapman to McCully-Chapman 
Exploration Inc., 12-22-04, NW 1/ 
4 Sec. 19, Blk. L, J. M. Lindsey 
Survey. 
JANUARY 5, 2005 
RDT-TC Investments II LLC to 
Gary Dan Hall, et ux, 12-17-04, 
See Instrument. 

shower in her honor at the UPC in 
Allison at two p.m. Wednesday. 
Everyone is welcome. It will be so 
much fun with the baby there. 
Cookies and punch will be served. 

Good to hear that Pete Gilmer is 
back. We always miss him at 
church when he is gone. 

One more star for my husband 
He has been going with us ladies 
from the Allison Pentecostal 
Church the first Tuesday of each 
month to the Wheeler Care Center 
to sing to the residents. Louise 
plays the piano and the rest of us 
enjoy singing God's praises in 
hymn. Vance has a good bass 

MD-Joyce Gayle Schones to 
Ferrelloil Co. LLC, 12-1-04, NE 1/ 
4 Sec. 6, Blk. L, J. M. Lindsey 
Survey. 
MD-Ferrelloil Co., LLC to DNR 
Oil & Gas Inc., et al, 12-21-04, NE 
1/4 Sec. 6, Blk. L, J. M. Lindsey 
Survey. 
POA-Gary Baird to David 0. 
Fogleman, et al, 9-22-04. 
POA-Sue Forster to Anthony 
Todd Forster, et al, 9-17-04. 
MD-Gary Don Baird to Ferrelloil 
Co. LLC, 12-30-04, NE 1/4 Sec. 6, 
Blk. L, J. M. Lindsey Survey. 
MD-Sue Forster to Ferrelloil Co. 
LLC, 12-30-04, NE 1/4 Sec. 6, Blk. 
L, J. M. Lindsey Survey. 
ASSIGN.-Vernon Davenport to 
Wendell C. Morgan, et al, 9-1-04, 
Sec. 21 and E 1/2 Sec. 22, Blk. 17, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey.  
ROW-Francis M. Grimes, et ux 
to Enbridge Pipelines (TexasGath-
ering) LP, 12-14-04, 100' x 100' 
SE 1/4 Sec. 28, Blk. A-9, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
ASSIGN.-Trigg Drilling Company 
to Dominion Oklahoma Texas Ex-
ploration & Production Inc., 12-17-
04, Sec. 28, Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
OL-Ed & Margaret Roberts Trust, 
et al to Continental Land Re-
sources LLC, 10-11-04, Sec. 39, 
Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
OL-Almarie R. Hulbert to Conti-
nental Land Resources LLC, 10-
2-04, E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E, 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Ruth Rydbeck to Continental 
Land Resources LLC, 10-1-04, E 
1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., Roberts & 
Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Charles F. Doornbos Revo-
cable Trust to Continental Land 
Resources LLC, 9-14-04, E 1/2 
Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., Roberts & 
Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Jack Donelson, et ux to Con-
tinental Land Resources LLC, 10-
4-04, E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Betty Rydbeck Holt to Conti-
nental Land Resources LLC, 9-
29-04, E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Bruce Donelson to Continen-
tal Land Resources LLC, 9-20-04, 
E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., Roberts &  

voice and it really adds something 
special to the singing. We really 
enjoy having Vance aboard. We 
all truly are blessed in this en-
deavor. Everyone there is so sweet 
to us. May God Bless you all till we 
meet again. 

P.S. Julie, be ready, because 
one evening soon, we will be 
knocking on your door for a game 
of spinners! OK? 

And a belated Happy Birthday 
number fifteen to one of my star 
Sunday School pupils, Cody 
Dupont. Vance and I are really 
proud of his bull riding nephew. 
He's a real line young man! 

Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Diane K. Donelson Trust to 
Continental Lind Resources LLC, 
9-23-04, E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Corwin C. Hulbert to Conti-
nental Land Resources LLC, 10-
4-04, E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-David E. Rydbeck to Conti-
nental Land Resources LLC, 9-
29-04, E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Karis Reitan Crocco to Con-
tinental Land Resources LLC, 9-
22-04, E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Dorothy Rydbeck Reitan to 
Continental Land Resources LLC, 
10-19-04, E 1/2 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Phillip Richard Reitan to Con-
tinental Land Resources LLC, 10-
15-04, E 12 Sec. 15, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
OL-Donna Rydbeck Thompson 
to Continental Land Resources 
LLC, 9-14-04, Sec, 22, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
JANUARY 6, 2005 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
Exploration Limited Partnership to 
Chesapeake Investments, et al, 
12-20-04, Sec. 5, Blk. A-3, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 12-20-04, SE 1/4 
Sec, 21, Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 12-20-04, 336.01 acs. 
Sec. 1, Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 12-20-04, W 1/2 (332 
acs.) Sec. 70, Blk. A-7, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 12-20-04, NE 1/4 
Sec. 32, Blk. R.E., Roberts & 
Eddleman Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 12-20-04, W 1/2 Sec. 
31, Blk. R.E., Roberts & Eddleman 
Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp., et al to Chesapeake 
Investments, et al, 12-20-04, Sec. 
26, Camp County School Land. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 10-7-04, 231.79 acs. 
Sec. 1, C&M Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 10-14-04, Sec. 67, 
Blk. A-7, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 10-7-04, N 1/2 Sec. 1, 
Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
PARTIAL ASSIGN.-Chesapeake 
BNR Corp. to Chesapeake Invest-
ments, et al, 10-7-04, W 1/2 Sec. 
22, Blk. R.E., Robens & Eddleman 
Survey. 
C/C MERGER-Oneok Gas Pro-
cessing LLC, et al to Oneok Field 
Services Company, 12-27-04. 

CARD OF THANKS 
The Family of E.J. Meadows 

would like to thank family, friends, 
communities for all the love, 
prayers, visits, calls, flowers, and 
food during this difficult time. 

We would like to especially thank 
Dr. Mendiola, Dr. Galutia, Ambu-
lance Service, Parkview Hospital 
Staff for the excellent care. To 
Pastors Dick Irvine and Shawn 
Johnson for the beautiful words, 
message. and music. To the 
Church of Christ for allowing the 
use of the facilities and the lun-
cheon provided. Also thanks to 
Wright Funeral Home. 

We have found Wheeler County 
the greatest place to be. God Bless 
each and everyone that touched 
E.J.'s life. 

Joe Meadows 
Keivin and Michelle Meadows 

and Family 
Misty Meadows 
Margie Meadows 
Brady and Sarah Meadows 

and Family 
Richard and Bonnie Meadows 

and Family 
John Meadows 

Mobeetie from Page 2) 

Edwards, Earl and Mabel Tabor, 
Bill and Patsy Caswell, 
Wilhelmenia Sherrell, Lorene Rec-
tor, Evelyn Haning, Orville Green-
house. Shelton May and family, 
McKaylee Swift and family, Judy 
Cloud, Sgt. Jim Kephart and fam-
ily, Frankie Fletcher, Tom Hetton 
and the family of Alice Bell Helton, 
Joy Meadows and the family of 
E.J. 	Meadows, 	Gladys 
Richardson, "Tommie" Minerva 
Jones, Willis and Verna Fillingim, 
Deidra Dukes Harris and family, 
Earl and Leola Farris, Dick and 
Ann Graham, Marvel Graham. 

Hope you have a great week. 

• 

• 
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Ft. Elliott Royalty: Ft. Elliott Homecoming activities were Friday, Jan. 14. Pictured here are the king and 
queen candidates: (I. to r.) Shantell Meek, Russell Lohberger, Andria Keelin, Justen Bryant, Sarah 
Zybach, Nathan McLaughlin, Tamara Hefley and Jason Boydston. 

Andrea Keelin is escorted by Jason Boydston at 
the homecoming activities. 

Shantell Meek is escorted by Russell Lohberger, 
at Ft. Elliott's Homecoming activities Friday, Janu-
ary 14, 2005. 

THRIMAY SUPERMARKET 
300 EAST OKLAHOMA 

WHEELER 
826-5944 PHONE 826-3345 EA 

Sarah Zybach is escorted by Nathan McLaughlin 
at Ft. Elliott's Homecoming activities on Friday, 
January 14, 2005. 

Tamara Hefley, has as her escort, Justen Bryant 
as they are introduced at the Homecoming 
coronation January 14, at Briscoe. 

Ft. Elliott Jr. High Cheerleaders (I. to r.) Tisha 
McLaughlin, Morgan McDowell and Megan 
Horn, do their thing at homecoming. 

Shealee Coulter takes a rest from her cheering 
duties on top of the Ft. Elliott Cougar. 

Shealee Coulter, #5, takes a free shot in the 
Higgins game. 

MARKET SQUARE THRIFTVAY 
205 EAST THIRD 

SHAMROCK 
256-2481 PHONE 256-5060 FAX  

MOORE INSURANCE AGENCY 
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TODD MOORE 
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SHAMROCK, TX 79079 
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i 71. 	 WELCOME 	TO 
(FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

8TH AT MAIN - P.O.BOX 89 - WHEELER, TX 79096 
CHURCH (806) 826-3114 - PARSONAGE (806) 826-3079 

Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 

	

Ricky Carstensen, Morning Worship 	 11:00 a_m. 

Pastor 	Old Fashioned Hymn Singing. 
Sunday 	 5:30 p.m, 

	

Community Evening Praise Service (180 Youth Center) 	7:00 p.m. 

SO EASY, NO WONDER 
40 MILLION PEOPLE USE 

Get your refund in half the usual time — even faster with Direct Diposit —
using IRS e-file. We'll prepare your return and file it with the IRS electronically. 
It's accurate, secure and fast, with proof of acceptance within 48 hours —It's 
paperless too! 

Do you owe taxes? Get the benefits of IRS a-file and e-pay in a single step by 
electronic funds withdrawal (direct debit) or credit card. Ask how you can 
schedule an electronic withdrawal or make a credit card payment. 

Come in or call us today. 

Charles Kuntz, CPA 
111 W. Texas 	121 S. Main 
Wheeler, TX 79096 	Shamrock, TX 79079 

(806) 826-5516 	(806) 256-3790 
1-800-313-5516 
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Orleans, Louisiana and met Ray's 
brother, LeRoy, and Lavergne 
Hudson from Arlington there, They 
especially enjoyed being together 
and visiting and playing cards and 
the big D-Day Museum. Except 
Laverne and Glenda both got very 
sick about the time they started to 
come home on Monday and Tues-
day, Jan. 10 and 11. Glenda went 
to a doctor in Wheeler three times, 
but is still very sick with fever and 
coughing on Saturday, Jan. 15 
and very weak and unable to eat 
much. Pray for them. Glenda is 
some better. 

Glenda Hudson's granddaugh-
ter, Allison Graddy, of Wichita Falls 
is involved in many things. She got 
to go with the Show Choir to see 
"River Dance" at Oklahoma City 
Saturday. The Show Choir has 
also earned a trip to Branson, Mis-
souri on Spring Break. Allison, a 
fifth grader, also plays on a bas-
ketball league and rides horses 
when she gets a chance. Her mom, 
Jennifer Grady, is office manager 
for River Bend Nature Center, and 
plans to go back to college two 
days a week for more training in 
the medical field. 

Cheryl and Jeff Fraley and 
Steven were weekend visitors to 
Sonya Hudson and Patrick and 
Rodney and Keri Hudson and 
Hayden and Kailey. Rodney's fam-
ily have found a house in Allison 
and have started moving some 
things in. Yea! 

Nice to have a phone call from 
Erma Riley at Tuttle, Oklahoma. 
She is doing all right. Has gone to 
church there a few times when not 
too cold. Many sweet people there. 
She still misses Ed after all those 
years and her friends here. She 
hopes to come back and visit some 
time when she gets a little stonger. 
Erma had enjoyed a visit from her 
son, Bob, and wife, Gayle, and a 
phone call from old friend, Janice 
Jaco Marrs, from Moore, Okla-
homa. 

David and Rita Pearson visited 
Ken and Lindsey Criswell and Blain 
and Dagen in Canyon over the 
weekend. They all ate supper Sat-
urday night at Furrs. Sunday Dave 
and Rita kept the boys awhile so 
Ken and Lindsey could go on a 
date and eat out, and see a movie. 

When Jesus was here on earth, 
he told many stories about down 
to earth things to explain heavenly 
things. As we get older we get 
discouraged that our minds and 
bodies, backs, fingers, legs don't 
work as well to do the things we 
would like them to do. But you 
don't drive a car 70 miles an hour 
without slowing down for corners 
and intersections. Our bodies are 
slowing down forthe biggest cross-
roads of our lives and we learn to 
compensate with canes and walk-
ers and scooters and helpful 
people. Enjoythe scenery. God be 
with you! 

Sorry to hear that Frankie 
Fletcher had a stroke. Remember 
her in your prayers. 

Sincere sympathy to family and 
friends of Hazel Hendrix in her 
death. She was in Wheeler Care 
Center a few months. She had 
cancer, 

Some honors Dallas Fillingim 
won at the Annual Winter meeting 
in San Diego of the Mid America 
Research Chemical Company 
were: 

2nd straight year to earn Cen-
tury Club Level, which is at least 
$125,000 sales; 1st time entry into 
Century Club II, which is over 
$200,000 sales; earned $550.00 
in 	Calif ornaia Bucks contest; 
earned $200 for Century Club II; 
received a second diamond in his 
Century Club ring; spouse received 
a pendant with second diamond; 
increased sales from $156,000 in 
2003 to $250,000 plus sales in 
2004; earned 10 Presidents 
Awards and $5000.00 for these 
awards; received President 
Plaque; received many extra in-
centive gifts f or 2004; received the 
Expanding the Globe trophy and 
$100.00 for having the most new 
accounts in the company; and re-
ceived for the 2nd year in a row the 
company Outstanding Improve-
ment Award. 

Dallas also made a speech to 
other reps on "Working Smarter". 
Congratulations, Dallas! David and 
Rita Pearson went with Dallas to  

San Diego. They stayed at the 
U.S. Grant Hotel, took a Harbor 
boat ride and saw many sights and 
wentto Tijuana, Mexico. They also 
did some shopping and went to a 
welcome reception on Saturday 
night. Dallas got many awards 
there. 

Alice Bell Helton 
Sincere sympathy to family and 

friends of dear friend, Alice Bell 
Helton, 92, in her death at Amarillo 
Tuesday night. like someone said, 
"She's earned her wings." Tho-
mas Roy and Martha Helton and 
Sharon Zamora went to Amarillo 
Tuesday and saw Alice Bell and 
Ton-i. They had not been home 
very long when Alice Bell passed 
away. Funeral was Friday at 
Wheeler Methodist Church with 
burial at Gageby near her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. King. Tom and Alice 
Bell raised their family in the 
Briscoe — Gageby area and in-
cluded Thomas Roy, Bobby, Joyce 
(Smith), Bill and Jack. Fine family. 
I remember we all went to Briscoe 
Methodist Church when their kids 
were pretty sma11.1 remember how 
cute those little boys were with 
their haircut and combed so neatly. 
(Most country boys didn't get their 
hair cut at the barber shops in the 
1930's.) 

I enjoyed teaching Thomas Roy, 
Bobby, Joyce and Bill some in 
about 2nd to 4th grades. Good 
students. 

There was a very large crowd 01 
family and friends out to Alice Bell 
Helton's funeral at Wheeler Meth 
odist Church Friday. She looked 
so pretty in the casket in spite of 
being sick for some time. Good 
job, Jim Wright. Good to see Tom 
Helton there and all the family. 
We've enjoyed living in their house, 
but missed Tom and Alice Bell. So 
good to see so many old friends 
from many places there to visit 
with the family. Bro. Joe Jernigan 
sang 2 songs. Bro. Ricky 
Carstenson, pastor, brought a 
good message. Bobbie Emmert  
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played the organ. Pallbearers were 
grandsons. 

"God be with you till we meet 
again.- 

Chat 	(from Page 1) 

and aready to go to the printers. 
--c we-- 

We stayed home this weekend 
to complete the recovery stage. 

--cwe— 
We were surprised with a visit 

from Craig and Karen Arnold of 
OKC. They were on their way home 
from Amarillo. Karen's first visit to 
Wheeler. 

—CWE'-- 

Sunday afternoon Craig's par-
ents, Gene and Melba Arnold from 
Del City stopped by on their way 
home from Amarillo. Gene and 
Melba had been bluegrassing in 
Amarillo. 

—cwe— 
We had cards on Monday 

evening. Patsy and Dwight won 
the first game. Barbara and I were 
partners until Bob arrived; Bob and 
I managed to make enough points 
to win the second and third games. 

—Cwe— 

Listen to . . 

KPDR-FM, 90.5 
WHEELER, TEXAS 

KELTON hell E  

MONDAY, January 24, 2005 —
FRIDAY, Friday, January 28, 
2005 
MONDAY 
Breakfast: Cereal, Toast, Juice, 
Milk 
Lunch: Chicken Strips, Mashed 
Potatoes, Gravy, Green Beans, 
Hot Rolls, Fruit, Milk 
TUESDAY 
Breakfast: Biscuits, Gravy, Juice, 
Milk 
Lunch: Hamburger Casserole, 
Potato Wedges, Carrots, Toast, 
Fruit, Milk 
WEDNESDAY 	 _ 

Breakfast: Eggs, Sausage, Bis-
cuits, Jelly, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Pizza, Corn, Salad, Pud-
ding, Milk 
THURSDAY 
Breakfast: French Toast Sticks, 
Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Hamburgers wiTrim-
mings, French Fries, Ice Cream, 
Strawberries, Milk 
FRIDAY: 
Breakfast: Blueberry Muffins, 
Toast, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: B.B.Q. on Bun, Pickles, 
Onions, Potato Salad, Baked 
Beans, C000kies, Fruit, Milk 
AAani 	CI ,Mont In rhoneve 
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