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Road Q uestion U nresolved In Meet
Soil Conservation 
Service Holds Meet

Thursday morning, more 
than 20 people met in the 
Muleshoe City Council chamb­
ers to discuss the present Soil

James Byers and Raymond 
Davenport, both of the local 
General Telephone Company 
office, recently attended a two- 
week training school at the 
company's training center in 
San Angelo.

The course, station trouble 
shooting, is designed to give 
employees up-to-date training 
in locating and repairing trouble 
found in business and residen­
tial telephones, according to 
Jean G. Ryon, public informa­
tion manager.

• • • • *
Terry Stewart, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. Charles Stewart, grad­
uated from Texas State Techni­
cal Institute at Amarillo on 
Friday, May 26.

He graduated from the Live­
stock and Ranch Operations 
Program.

Janis St. Clair, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill St. Clair, was 
among the 693 students who 
graduated from Emporia State 
University, Emporia. Kansas 
during spring commencement 
exercises.

She received a Masters of 
Science degree.

• • • • •
Bailey County Sheriff Dee 

Clements was expected to be 
released from St. Mary’s Hospi­
tal at Lubbock during the week­
end.

He will be recuperating at 
the home of his son, Lubbock 
County Deputy Sheriff, Travis 
Clements.

Incidentally, just io case you 
didn't know, the Muleshoe Jay-, 
cees named M.D. Gunstream 
Muleshoe's Outstanding Citizen 
of the Year at their recent 
Installation and Awards ban­
quet.

•  * « • •
A fund has been established 

to aid Donita Dale, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Dale, who 
has been a patient at St. 
Anthony's Hospital in Amarillo 
for nearly two months.

Contributions will be used to 
help defray medical expenses. 
She underwent her fourth sur­
gery at the hospital on Thurs­
day. Contributions may be made 
at Muleshoe State Bank.

•  • • * *
Bailey County Agent Spenc­

er Tanksley, along with Jimmy 
Gleason. Kelly Harrison and 
Greg Harrison, left for the state 
4-H round-up Monday, where 
the young men will participate 
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Conservation Service programs 
and to make suggestions for 
future programs.

Moderating the program 
were Doug Bales, president of 
the Black water Valley Soil and 
Water Conservation District and 
Jerry Wemmohs, manager of 
the local office.

More water conservation 
through irrigation practices was 
one item brought out by several 
speakers, who also advocated 
more input on a local level 
viewing restrictions or the farm 
programs.

Don Smith of the Hi Plains 
Underground Water District of 
Lubbock, suggested a more 
efficient use of water and that 
utilization of all units of govern­
ment be considered to help the 
conservation programs.

It was brought out by Har­
mon Elliott, of the First National 
Bank, that even though the Soil 
Conservation attempts to notify 
users of programs available, 
that not enough people are 
learning of available programs 
and suggested more advertis­
ing.

In response to a question as 
to whether or not more work 
could be turned over to a 
clerk/typist/receptionist to turn 
the trained personnel loose to 
work more out in the field, Bales 
said the fact that personnel are 
tied up in red tape and paper­
work is a major area of concern.

Ginton Kennedy, manager 
of the local FHA office said he 
has worked next door to the SCS 
for 21 years and understands 
their problems. He said that if 
the local workers are out in the 
field where they are needed, 
someone comes in and expects 
someone to be available to 
answer their questions. He add­
ed to the request for fulltime 
office personnel.

Another area brought out in 
the discussion was in the field of 
energy versus water by Bill 
Broadhurst, area farmer.

“Conservation to me means 
it is based on orderly develop­
ment and provident use of 
available supplies and the know­
ledge of economical conditions 
at the time," he said.

Broadhurst also added, 
"Just over 100 years ago there 
was no need for petroleum 
conservation on this earth. To­
day, it is a concern worldwide. 
Now, we have a water concern 
for conservation and maybe 100 
years from now, it will no longer 
be a concern, but it is now."

He asked that it be let known 
to local farmers that they can 
help from a practical standpoint 
in eliminating government red 
tape and also asked for more 
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Bula Residents Visit 
Com missioners Court

FNJOYING RED RAIDER DAY-Caught as they came around the golf course at the Muleshoe Country Chib late Tuesday afternoon were a
group of men enjoying the golf at Red Raider Day. Pictured from left, Paul Wilbanks, J.B. Stevenson, Gaude Riley, Red Raider Coach Bud 
Casey and Bernard Phelps. Following the afternoon of golf, a dinner was served to the Red Raider Coaches and staff from Texas Tech
University.

Tornados Bounce Around; 
Beneficial Rains Fall

Stunned, unsuspecting Bail­
ey County residents went to be 
Thursday night unaware that a 
major storm was building in the 
southwestern part of the county.

First inkling of the severity 
of the storm, other than con­
stant rumbling of thunder and

Relative 
Sought 
In Area

Clyde A. Miller, of Star 
Route Two, Box 123, Heavener, 
Oklahoma is looking for an uncle 
in this area.

He said the last time he had 
heard, his uncle, Ira Cook, was 

-living in the area. Miller said 
Cook's sister, is his mother, 
Mary Lee Miller, and the man 
he is seeking had a brother, 
Osker, who is deceased, and two 
more sisters, Mirt and Anna, 
with last names unknown.

Ira Cook had a daughter 
named Claudie, but he docs not 
know who she married, al­
though he does believe she had 
children. He said he would like 
to hear from some of her 
children.

If Ira Cook is living, he 
would be around 85 years of 
age. If any reader knows any of 
these people, they are asked to 
contact Clyde A Miller, the 
Muleshoe Chamber of Comm­
erce and Agriculture or The 
Journal in Muleshoe.

LISTENING CLOSELY-Speakers at the Soil Conservation meeting Thursday morning found many dose
listeners. From left, are Spencer Tanksley, Bailey County Extension Agent; Harmon Elliott, vice 
president. First National Bank; Bill Broadhurst. farmer and Al Jones, manager of the Muleshoe National 
Wildlife Refuge.

almost as constant brilliant 
lightning was at 10:50 p.m. 
when a couple drove to the 
Bailey County Law Enforcement 
Center in Muleshoe.

The frightened couple re­
ported a tornado just to the 
southwest of the Longview Bap­
tist Church. The residents of 
that area said they had watched 
the funnel come almost to the 
ground before going back up 
into the clouds.

Law Enforcement officers.

Hawkins, Dale 
Are Selected 
For Workshop

Mike Dale and Keith Haw­
kins, Muleshoe High School 
members of Future Farmers of 
America, have been selected to 
attend Southwestern Public Ser­
vice Companys’ 16th annual 
Farm Electrification Workshop.

More than 100 FFA mem­
bers and leaders will attend the 
workshop to be held June 12-14 
at the Episcopal Conference 
Center in Amarillo.

The FFA members, who 
come from Texas and New 
Mexico, will be competing for 
five trips to the National FFA 
Convention at Kansas City, Mo. 
Thirteen hours of instruction are 
offered in each of three sub­
jects, Farm Motors, Farm Wir­
ing and Electric Controls.

Two students from the Wir­
ing and Motor Courses and one 
from the Controls course are 
selected as outstanding and 
receive the trips to Kansas City 
for their accomplishment. Each 
student who finishes the course 
he is enrolled in is awarded a 
certificate. Alternates are sel­
ected in each course in the event 
the winner is unable to attend 
the convention.

Heading the staff of instruc­
tors at the workshop are Ken 
Pollard, Texas A&M Agricul­
tural Engineering Department. 
Electric Controls; Bobby Brown­
ing, Texline, Farm Wiring; Don 
Ham, Dalhart, Farm Wiring; 
Frank Kennedy, Vega. Farm 
Motors and Jay Eudy, Turkey, 
Farm Motors.

The program for the confer­
ence was coordinated by Walter 
Labay, Area I Vocational Agri­
culture Supervisor and Sam 
Thomas, SPS Agriculture Deve­
lopment Manager. Glenn Bick- 
el, SPS Sales Engineer, will 
moderate the general sessions.

the Muleshoe Volunteer Fire 
Department and Bailey County 
Civil Defense members were 
notified and weather watches 
were immediately set up. 
KMUL activated the storm sen­
try alarms on the heels of three 
additional reports of tornados, 
which included at the same 
time, twin tornados to the 
southwest of King's Feedyard; 
in the Longview area and a- 
round Needmore.

For the first time this year, 
storm shelters were opened at 
the Moleshoe City Hall, the 
Muleshoe Area Public Library 
and the basement of the court­
house. Families of Civil Defense 
workers and law enforcement 
personnel families quickly filled 
the basement of the law enforce-

A reaR estS top  
Conducted Fo r 
M emorial Day

Triangle CB Gub of Bailey, 
Parmer and Lamb Counties, 
conducted a holiday rest stop on 
Highway 60 at a roadside park 
near Bovina during the Memor­
ial Day weekend.

The rest stop opened on 
Friday afternoon and closed 
after lunch on Monday after 
being operated around the 
clock. Free coffee and tea were 
served with cold drinks, sand­
wiches and cupcakes being sold 
with proceeds designated for 
Girlstown at Whiteface.

It was reported that approx­
imately 750 people stopped for 
refreshments and rest during 
the weekend. One family with 
car trouble had their car repair­
ed by Triangle CB members to 
continue their journey. The 
disabled car was occupied by 
Mrs. Dorothy Huckabee, who 
was formerly a dietician at 
Amherst Hospital and had work­
ed with Dr. McDaniel, Dr. 
Birdsong and Dr. Slemmons.

Eight members took camp­
ers and trailers and stayed the 
entire weekend. Conducting the 
rest stop were Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Webb and children and 
Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Moody 
and children, all of Bovina; Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Burnett and 
Carl Burnett. Sudan; Mr. and 
Mrs. Donald Prather and child­
ren; Mrs. and Mrs. Owen 
Jones, Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
Wellborn, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Phillips, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
McCamish, Ray Gayton, J.D. 
Duncan and Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Payne and daughter, all of- 
Muleshoe and WarTen Jones, 
Lubbock.

ment center.
As reports of tornados were 

coming in, some of them report­
ed to be as near Muleshoe as 12 
miles southwest, personnel of 
the Muleshoe Nursing Home 
evacuated patients into the hall­
ways, followed by evacuating 
patients at West Plains Medical 
Center into hallways until the 
threat of the storm passed after 
1:30 a.m.

National Weather Service, 
who had not issued a severe 
weather forecast for the area 
quickly revised the forecast as 
they started confirming the 
tornados on radar.

A short, hard rain fell on 
Muleshoe during the storm, 
leaving less than one-quarter of 
an inch of moisture, however, 
rain started falling again around 
8:00 a.m. and continued 
throughout the day Friday.

At Bula, Gaunch Gin report­
ed that rain started there around 
5 a.m. Friday morning and had 
fallen in a slow, steady rain all 
day. More than an inch and a 
half of rain had fallen late 
Friday afternoon, with no hail 
damage.

Mrs. Buck Ragsdale in the 
Stegall community reported that 
one inch had fallen in that area 
and in the Maple and Goodland 
areas. "It was a very beneficial 
rain," she said, and no hail 
damage was reported.

At 8 a.m. at the Muleshoe 
National Wildlife Refuge, .74 
had fallen and an additional .84 
brought the total of 1.56 inches 
by 12:30. Rain was continuing 
during Friday, and Bill Long 
said the lakes on the refuge 
were beginning to fill.

Two to two and a half inches 
was reported in the Coyote Lake 
area with no hail or wind 
damage recorded.
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Sales Counselor 
Membership To 

Charles Mayhugh
Ford Division of the Ford 

Motor Company recently an­
nounced that Charles Mayhugh 
has attained membership in the 
Ford Society of Professional 
Sales Counselors for 1977.

A spokesman said society 
membership can only be attain­
ed by those Ford salesmen who 
display outstanding sales a- 
chievement during the calendar 
year.

Mayhugh is employed with 
Muleshoe Motor Company, 
Inc., and has been a member of 
their sales staff since 1973.

A strip of road, 8.4 miles 
long, has created a problem in 
the Bula community in south­
east Bailey County. A roomful of 
Bula area residents and other

Work lo g it *  
0» Hooslog 
Far E lforly
"It is the intention and 

desire of the housing authority 
board members to build a nice, 
comfortable housing complei 
for senior citizens,” said Chair­
man Harmon Elliott, following a 
meeting, Wednesday, of the 
board.

Elliott, along with board 
members Jim Cox, Myron Pool 
ID, Jesse Leal and Tim Camp­
bell met with the city architect 
and Clinton Kennedy of Farm­
ers Home Administration to 
discuss construction of the facil­
ity.

He said the Housing Author- 
its Board met and voted to 
become active in pursuing ac­
quisition of a housing complex 
for aging and senior citizens. 
The chairman said the project is 
in the planning stages now and 
they have secured the services 
of the same architect and en­
gineer who is presently con­
structing the Agricultural Hous­
ing Project which is underway.

The immediate need is to 
determine the needs and how 
many people will be involved, 
he added, and they are planning 
to pursue receiving funds from 
FHA for construction. From the 
determination of need, an ap­
plication for a loan for construc­
tion will be made.

Elliott said the cost of occup­
ancy in the housing will be 
determined by a percentage 
basis of the applicant's income, 
and the housing will be limited 
to senior citizens.

Mrs. Buck Creamer is work­
ing with the Housing Authority 
on contacting people who have 
expressed a desire for such 
housing, added Elliott, who 
invited persons interested in 
living in the project to contact 
Mrs. Creamer at 272-3265 or 
contact him at First National 
Bank. 272-4515.

Polk* Chief 
Resigns Pott 
To Movo Away

First item for Muleshoe City 
Council members to consider in 
a special meeting Thursday 
morning was the resignation of 
Muleshoe City Police Chief 
Claude A. (Buddy) Black.

Black is resigning, effective 
June 17, to move to Central 
Texas to go into private busi­
ness.

He said, "This has not been 
an easy decision to reach as the 
City of Muleshoe has been my 
hometown, employer, and the 
majority of the citizens have 
worked with me as a law 
enforcement officer and Chief of 
Police.

"The city government I have 
served under has provided the 
financial assistance to attempt 
to continually upgrade the po­
lice department and provide 
better law enforcement for our 
city.”

Council members elected to 
accept applications for a new 
chief of police until approxi­
mately June 17, both from 
within the local law enforcement 
agencies and from outside 
Muleshoe.

In other business, the city 
council approved seeking a 
grant to upgrade the park 
facilities and discussed the pos­
sibility of new softball and 
baseball fields.

Also discussed were the 
'Welcome to Muleshoe' signs; 
the rate increase requested by 
Southwestern Public Service 
Company and waived a building 
permit for the Muleshoe Inde­
pendent School System to con­
struct a new warehouse at the 
school.

interested persons crowded into 
the Muleshoe City Council 
Chambers Wednesday for a 
meeting with the Bailey County 
Commissioners Court.

Bailey County Judge Glen 
Williams moderated the meet­
ing, which *was an attempt to 
settle the problems which have 
arisen in the projected construc­
tion of a new farm to market 
road in the southeast part of the 
county.

On hand for the meeting 
were Commissioners Rudolph 
Moraw, Bob Sanders and Loyd 
Stephens and the entire Coch­
ran County Commissioners 
Court, including County Judge 
Glenn Thompson, and Commis­
sioners, Bill Carter, Bob Daw­
son, Richard Keith and E.J. 
McKissick. Bailey County Com­
missioner Matt Dudley was not 
present.

Judge Williams explained 
that the Bula community people 
had requested the meeting on 
the Farm-to-Market Road situa­
tion in that area. He said that 
the controversy had (“risen over 
location of the road. Presently, 
the commissioners have entered 
into a contract with the state to 
acquire rights-of-way for con­
struction of the new pavement, 
but with the problems which 
have arisen, the meeting was 
being held to attempt to resolve 
some of the problem.

Richard Black acted as 
speaker for one group of people, 
and his first assurance was that 
he did not want to offend 
anyone, as he enumerated a list 
of who he expected the new 
pavement to benefit if it were 
constructed due north from Bula 
to connect with the highway one 
mile east of Circleback, as 
opposed to the presently ap­
proved site which will be due 
south of Circleback and connect 
with Highway 54 one mile west 
of Bula.

“This is a very serious 
question," said Black, "And 
one which has created hard 
feelings and has divided our 
community.”

Black emphasized that truth 
is like beauty and is in the eye of 
the beholder, and especially 
holds true when trying to decide 
where to construct the new 
pavement.

He enumerated persons on 
both the considered roads and 
said it was his opinion that the 
road would serve the most 
people if the road from Bula 
north were paved.

He sited figures saying it 
would be cheaper on both the 
county and state if that road 
were constructed and asked the 
Cochran County officials to join 
construction to the south of Bula 
to meet the proposed road.

For the west road, or the 
road from Circleback to the 
south, Ndlan Harlan said it 
would benefit that area as 
several children who ride school 
buses are located along that 
road. “The state pays priority to 
school children," he said, and 
added that such a road would be 
a main artery for the school bus 
from the Sudan School District 
to take the students to Sudan to 
school.

Harlan asked that the com­
missioners court keep the pre­
sent plans to pave the ‘west 
road.' He said they are present­
ly acquiring right of ways for 
construction on the 'west road.’

Jerry Ray told the group of a 
meeting in Austin with various 
Highway Department officials 
and said they have also visited 
in the Lubbock offices and have 
been unable to find anyone who 
turned down paving on the ‘east 
road.’

He said also that on June 9, 
1975, in the absence of the 
county judge and the county 
clerk, the commissioners had 
changed plans to pave the east 
road to paving of the west road 
and submitted the new plan to 
the state.

Judge Williams then ex­
plained that an overall proposal 
for paving of roads throughout 
the county had been declined, 
which included paving of ‘the 
east road' but one road, from 
the Y-L Highway to Highway 84 
had been re-submitted and was
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Sudan News
f  ve/yn Rife hi•

The Major team of the Sudan 
Little Dribblers won all their 
games during the weekend and 
have advanced to nationals 
which will be in Levelland with 
the first game to be played 
Wednesday, May 31, against 
Twin County.

The Sudan girls won over 
Seminole, 35-32; and over Taho- 
ka, 32-12. These games were 
played Thursday. On Friday the 
locals won over Brownfield, 
36-19. They also won over 
Littlefield, 38-16.

The Senior League placed 
2nd in their games with Dalhart 
being the winner. The Minors 
lost their first two games. 
Congratulations are in order for 
all these girls and especially to 
the Majors team, consisting of: 
Missy Fisher, Kim Powell, 
Shawni DeLoach, Tatia New­
som, Gussy Wooley, Sherry 
Williams, Jeannia Nil, Sharia 
Harrison, Sherry Powell, 
Shawnda Master and alternates 
Marissa Newsom and Rita Willi­
ford. Pam Humphreys was their 
coach.

Linda Locke and James were 
in Muleshoe Thursday to visit 
relatives.

Visiting in the Ritchie home 
recently were her sister and 
nephew, Mrs. Nonie Watson 
and Joe of Farmington, N.M. 
Evelyn accompanied them to 
Pulaski, Tenn. and to other 
points of interest.

• •  •  •  •
Mrs. Whittenburg, mother 

of Jerry Coi, visited in Sudan 
Thursday night to attend the 
Eighth Grade Graduation of her 
grandson, Jamie Cox.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Tamp- 
lin and daughter of Dallas 
visited recently with their par­
ents and attended the gradua­
tion of his brother, Edgar, on 
Friday night.

Former 3-Way 
RetidentD ied  
A t Levelland

A former Bailey County resi­
dent, Mrs. C.B. Hightower, 68, 
died at 8:50 a.m. Friday, May 26 
at Highland Hospital in Lubbock 
following a lengthy illness.

A resident of Levelland, 
Mrs. Hightower had moved 
there in 1973 from Three Way. 
She was a native of Callahan 
County, Texas; and was married 
to C.B. Hightower on July 31, 
1926 at Lubbock. She was a 
Methodist.

Funeral services for Mrs. 
C.B. Hightower were conducted 
at 2 p.m. on Tuesday, May 30 at 
the George C. Price Funeral 
Chapel, Levelland. Officiating 
were Rev. Wayne Perry, Chap­
lain, Highland Hospital, Lub­
bock and Rev. Jerry Lee Haley, 
pastor of First Baptist Church 
Edmondson. Burial was at Rest- 
haven Memorial Park, Lubbock.

Survivors include her hus­
band, C.B. Hightower; six 
daughters, Mrs. Charles Mor­
ris, Lubbock; Mrs. Everett 
Long, Denver, Colo; Mrs. Gene 
Bagline, Govis; Mrs. Benny 
Dunlap, Amarillo; Mrs. Doug 
Barnes, Levelland and Mrs. Jay 
Bird, Post; one son, Cecil Gene,
Amarillo; one brother, Bud Mc­
Kinney, Lubbock; one sister, 
Mrs. Lucille Roan, Austin; se­
ven grandchildren and four 
great-grandchildren.

B A R G A IN
of the MONTH

Quantities 
Limited

12-Ql LITE 
COOLER CHEST
Polyurethane insulated. 
Holds 12 cans, plus food, 
ice. Lid doubles as serving 
tray. Use on picnics, out­
ings, etc. Colors. 036

e &
ox

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Price and 
children of Plains were among 
those from out of town to attend 
the High School Graduation. 
Her brother, Jarod Withrow, 
was among those who received 
diplomas.

Here Friday to attend Grad­
uation Exercises for the High 
School seniors were friends and 
relatives of Jo Ann Gipson.

• • • * *
Visiting recently with Mr. 

and Mrs. John Williams and 
family were their parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. Williams and Mr. 
and Mrs. Charlie Lowe of Qua- 
nah. They attended the gradua­
tion of their grandson, Jimmy 
Williams.

Visiting Friday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Bob Hargrove and 
family were their parents, who 
also attended the graduation of 
their granddaughter, Kelli.

• * * •  •
Several Members of the 

Calvin Wiseman family attend­
ed the graduation exercises 
Friday night.

Several family members 
visited Friday with the Calvin 
Vernons when their daughter, 
Jody, participated in the Gradu­
ation exercises.

401 South First 

MULESHOE, TEXAS 79347

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Fisher 
and children of Ralls visited in 
Seminole and attended the Little 
Dribblers games. His sister, 
Missy is a member of the team. 

• • • •  •
Mr. and Mrs. Dwayne Pow­

ell and girls attended the Little 
Dribblers games in Seminole 
and then traveled to Midland to 
visit her brother and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. David Beckett.

Cirdeback Baptist Church 
will have its Vacation Bible 
School Monday, June 5 through 
Friday, June 9, from 2:30 until 
5:30 p.m. for ages four through 
Junior High. Commencement 
Exercises will be held Sunday 
evening at 6:30 p.m. and all 
parents and other interested 
persons are cordially invited.

Mr. and Mrs. S.T. Reece 
have returned home after a 
three month vacation in Ore 
City, at the Lake of the Pines. 
They also visited their daughter 
and granddaughters, Mrs. Mau­
reen Thomas, and Mrs. Denisse 
Evans of Dianna, and Mrs. 
Debra Nelko, of Lone Star. 

* • • • *
Mrs. Tom Lamphere, April 

and Julie of Lewisville, arrived 
Friday to visit their parents and 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
G.C. Ritchie and Steve, who was 
among the graduating seniors.

•  • • • •

Attending 8th grade Gradua­
tion Thursday night were the 
parents of Mrs. Truman John­
son. Their gTandson, Kendall, 
was among the graduates.

•  • • • •
Mrs. Donald Cox and Yvette 

of Enochs attended the eighth 
grade graduation of their ne­
phew, Jamie Cox.

Mrs. Calvin Wiseman ac­
companied the Little Dribblers 
to Dalhart Thursday.

Mrs. Lee Roy Fisher, Kathy 
Fisher and Mrs. Mary Powell 
accompanied some of the Little 
Dribblers to Seminole, Thurs­
day, Friday and Saturday.

Mrs. Warrena Roark has 
returned home from Spearman

where she has been visiting her 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Baber.

Some 28 children, along with 
their proud parents and Grand­
parents. graduated from Kind­
ergarten, May 16, 1978. The 
theme of the program was Walt 
Disney's Bambi. The characters 
were as follows: Mrs Magpie, 
Kay Lynn Gordon; Mr. Owl, 
Jacob Lowe; Bambi, Kyle Max- 
field; Bambi's mother, Wadona 
Bond; Thumper, Jarod Bellar; 
Thumper’s mother, Amie Bak­
er; Flower the skunk, Tyrone 
Johnson; Flowers, Gabriel 
Azua, Maria DeVinney, Jesse 
Camarillo, Susie Collins, Kristi 
Hargrove, Bertha Estrada, Ron­
nie Gonzales, Hyla Ford, Roch­
elle Mathis, Jay Harrison, Al-

minda Murillo, Becky Masters, 
Martin Netherland, Olga Mon­
tes, Stephanie Thornton, Sam­
my Munez, Missy Williamson, 
Mitze Glascock, Johnny Vega, 
Prospero Macias. April Cervant­
es.

Judy Lynch played the piano 
as the children performed and 
sang "Spring Song” , ‘TH Call 
Him Bambi", “ If You Can't Say 
Something Nice” , Through the 
Forest", “ Little April Shower” , 
and “ It’s So Nice On the Ice” . 
Presentation of Diplomas was 

, by Bernard Wilson, Principal 
and Miss Linda McAnally, 
Kindergarten teacher. Along 
with First, Second and Third 
graders, many friends attended. 
CONGRATULATIONS KIND 
GARTEN!!!!!

Perkin9Funeral H eld Sunday

ARTHUR PERKINS

Funeral services for Arthur 
Perkins, 73, were conducted on 
Sunday, May 28, in the Single- 
ton Ellis Funeral Home Chapel 
of the Chimes with Rev. Walter 
Bartholf, pastor of First Chris­
tian Church and Rev. James 
Williams, pastor of Calvary 
Baptist Church officiating. Bur­
ial was in Sudan Cemetery 
under direction of Singleton 
Ellis Funeral Home.

He had been a resident of 
Bailey County since 1925, mov­
ing here from Memphis. He 
died at 1:45 p.m. on Friday, 
May 26 at West Plains Medical 
Center.

He was a farmer, and a 
member of the First Baptist 
Church in Muleshoe since 1950.

Survivors include three sis­
ters, Mrs. T.W. Berry, Mule­
shoe; Mrs. George Fenton, Jas­
per, Alabama and Mrs. L.A. 
Harper, Forney, Texas and 
three brothers, Albert Perkins, 
Snyder; Lester Perkins, Forney. 
Texas; and J.B. Perkins, Cor­
dova, Alabama.

Life and misery began to­
gether.

-Thomas Fuller.

It is good to have compan­
ions in misery.

-John Gower.

It is hard for the happy to 
understand misery.

-Quintilian.

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Har­
vey of Littlefield visited in 
Sudan to attend the graduation 
of their nephew, Dennis Har­
vey.

•  • * • •
Cheryll Harvey has arrived 

home for the summer following 
the past year at Howard Payne 
College in Brownwood. She is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Halbert Harvey.

•  • •  • *
The TEL Sunday School 

Class of the First Baptist Church 
hosted a dinner Sunday, May 
21, in honor of the Senior 
Citizens of the Church.

• •  •  • •
Mrs. Jackie (Withrow) John­

son of Muleshoe visited in 
Sudan to attend the eighth 
grade graduation of her sister, 
Karla, and the High School 
Graduation of her brother, 
Jarod.

Mrs. Claud Kropp was in 
Crosby ton Sunday to be with her 
mother who is hospitalized 
there.

*  •  •  •  •

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Knox 
and daughter visited recently 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
R.B. Knox.

Mr. and Mrs. Jeff Lynsky 
and Bradlev of Lubbock were in 
Sudan Friday to attend the 
graduation of her brother, Dar­
ren Province.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Engram
visited in Lubbock recently with 
their son, Roy, who has moved 
into a new home.

Mr. and Mrs. John Kropp 
and Sonny of Muleshoe visited 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Claud Kropp and Oliver. Arriv­
ing Monday was another son, 
Tom Kropp, who is employed in 
Iran with Bell telephone. 

* • • • •
Mr. and Mrs. Nolan Parrish 

were in Seminole Saturday to 
attend the Little Dribblers 
games. Their granddaughter, 
Shawnda, is a member of the 
team. Also in Seminole Satur­
day to attend the games were 
Mr. and Mrs. W.C. Master, and 
Dale, Mrs. Gladys Glenn, Olin 
Nix, Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
De Loach, Mr. and Mrs. Wallace 
Goodin, Mr. and Mrs. A1 Harri­
son, Dottie LaGrone, Mr. and 
Mrs. Danny Master and Mrs. 
Pat Newsom.

!l a n u L
C  Q  A N T H O N Y  C O SPECIAL SELECTIONS

Textured Dress Shirts For Men
2 FOR 13.50 

O  * 3  FOR $20 /

B. Polyester and cotton Grand Vino* patterned tone-on-tone or white-on- p 
white dress shirt in sizes 14'/z-17. Reg. 7.99

C. 1 0 0 %  texturized polyester with Visa* finish to release soil ond stoins. I. 
Several colors. Sizes 14V^-17. Reg. 7.99

polyester ana cotton cuw.it -1 c. .« 
on placket collar, sleeves and pocket. Several colors. Sizes 
S -M -L -X L  Reg $».
Texturized 1 00 %  polyester V is e *  fin ish  cosuol/dress  
shirt Wear with a  tie or on  open collor. P lo cke l tront. 
Light and dork tones. Sizes S -M -L -X L _  Reg

" N

LEISURALLS BY WALLS*
plin.1 0 0 %  D o cro f#  p o ly tsttr  w ith th# look of 

Double top P itch in g . A d justab le  belt. Several colors. 
S izes 36-4 6 , Short, Reg. ond Toll.

M EN 'S POPLIN JUMPSUIT
Polyester ond cotton poplin jum psuit. 2-w oy zipper 
Rag lan  sleeves. Pockets galore Elastic  bock w aist­
band. Several colors. S izes S -M -L-X L . Reg . ond Long

26”

1 0 ?

\

K  Levi's fla re  jeans. M oderate fla re  leg w ith western pockets. Reg 14.50

• .  Levi's sh rin k-to -fit jeon. C la stic  stra ig ht leg look that's g uarantsed  to  
shrink, w rinkle and fade. Reg. U .6 0  

C  Le v i’s corduroy bell bottoms of polyester ond cotton blend Reg $16  

D . Levi's super bell blues in a ll cotton heavy weight denim. Reg. 15.50

L  L ev i's  soddtem on boat je an  —  cu t wider a t the bottom to fit  easy  
boots. Reg. 14.50 (N ot Shown I

a ® M e
W E S T E R N

B O O T S
VALUES TO 44.99

*39 ?
Toughness and  style built 
Into each  A cm e boot—- 
the leading brand  
ta r  n igged  western  
footwear. S izes 6 V 4 -I2 . 
Several styles.

-TO) CS . '-TO
CASH OR LAYAWAY

------------------- -<r> -

i # I
I



HEAVY, WET CLOUDS--Friday morning, low, heavy, wet clouds lingered in the Muleshoe and Bailey 
County area depositing a slow, steady rain following a night of numerous tornado reports late Thursday 
night and early Friday morning. The rain continued throughout the day.

Muleshoe...
Cont. from Page 1
in 4-H state livestock judging.

Also, at the round-up, Kirk 
Lewis, son of Mr. and Mrs. Leon 
Lewis, will have the opportunity 
to interview for a scholastic 
scholarship.

Rev. and Mrs. Cecil Os­
borne, Jr. have been in this area 
visiting her mother, Mrs. Cordie 
Taylor and his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Cecil Osborne, Sr., at 
Tulia.

He has accepted a position 
as interim pastor of a church in 
Powell, Wyoming and they left 
Tuesday for their new home. 

. . . . .
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Robinson 

and Onan Robinson, recently 
returned from a trip to Califor­
nia and Arizona. While in 
Arizona they visited a sister, 
Wilma Lynch and Family, a 
former resident of Muleshoe.

From there they went to 
Aguanga. California, where 
they attended a reunion held on 
the A.B. Robinson Land.

Former residents of Mule­
shoe attending the reunion were

Monk Sanders, Lloyd, Goober 
and Buren Robinson.

A Natal care class will be 
held at the Catholic Center at 
3:00 p.m. Tuesday, June 6. Any 
woman currently expecting and 
who has already seen a doctor or 
any interested women are urged 
to attend this meeting. The 
purpose of the class is to 
provide information on proper 
nutrition, health and exercise. 
The class will be sponsored by: 
the Texas Dept, of Health Res., 
Gov. office of Migrant Affairs, 
Llano Estacado Farm Workers 
of Lubbock and the Social Action 
Council of Muleshoe, Mrs. Deb­
bie Puente. Mrs. Marcelina 
Ovalle, of Social Action Council 
and Mrs. JoAnn Head, Mrs. 
Nesbitt, of Texas Ad Dept, of 
Health Res., will be in charge of 
the classes. For furthur informa­
tion, contact Marcus Puente, 
executive director of Social Ac­
tion Council, of Muleshoe, 
phone 272-3882.

Good Advice 
It's  much better to sit 

t ig h t - th a n  a tte m p t to 
drive in that condition.

-WOW Magazine.

Soif...
Cont. from Page 1

local advertising of what pro­
grams are available through soil 
conservation.

Joe Harbin of Bailey County 
Electric Cooperative said the 
electric company is working on 
an irrigation study and suggest­
ed farmers utilize testing equip­
ment to test the efficiency of 
their motors on the irrigation 
system on their own farm.

Although a cross section of 
agribusinessmen were repre­
sented Wenmohs said he hoped 
more people on a local level 
would have attended the meet­
ing because what comes out of a 
local meeting will have a bear­
ing on future conservation pro­
grams that the farmer will be 
living with for five years or more 
through new programs.

Also represented at the 
meeting were James Wedel, 
Spencer Tanksley, J.K. Adams, 
Eugene Shaw, Debra Nobles of 
the Young Homemakers and 
Muleshoe P-TA, and several 
other agribusinessmen.

Road...
Cont. from Page 1 

subsequently paved.
Ray asked repeatedly for the 

name and title of the state 
highway official who had turned 
down paving in the southeast 
part of the county, and added, 
“ Mr. Wall was heard by several 
men to say he would be delight­
ed to work on the east road 
which would put the paving 
farther away from highway 214 
which is also a north-south 
highway.”

Also speaking was a man 
who identified himself as Ed­
ward Riley, who is the pastor of 
the Bula Baptist Church. He 
said that regardless of which 
road is paved that sooner or 
later everyone who lives in the 
community will be paying for 
the road. He suggested that 
more and more people would be 
moving to Muleshoe where 
there is a greater opportunity 
for water.

Bennie Claunch asked Judge 
Thompson, from Morton, to 
speak on the road situation as 
they see it in considering build­
ing a road to connect with a 
paved road to the south in 
Bailey County.

The Cochran County Judge 
explained that they would make 
every effort to build a road to 
connect to a paved road to the 
Bailey County line. He also said 
Cochran County does not utilize 
state money in building roads, 
they use bond money as approv­
ed by county voters.

He said the county road 
hands do a lot of work during 
slack times. “ A lot of the time 
our roadhands do not have a lot 
to do in this drv country, so thev 
have time to pool their equip­
ment and lay grades and pre­
pare roads," he said. He added 
that once the roads are built, 
they are turned over to the state 
for maintenance.

Ivan Clawson told the group 
he had been a resident of the 
Bula community since 1937, and 
the area had repeatedly asked 
for paved roads. “ 1 think we 
have been patient long 
enough," he added.

Black then suggested a bond 
issue for the people in the south 
area of the county to make the 
paving and road improvements. 
“ This is not an all or nothing 
proposition for anyone in this 
room,” he said. “ We can all 
work together for the good of 
Bailey County.”

Judge Williams gave the 
requirements by state law to 
acquire paving and said the
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CAL HOMO MILK $1.83
i/2 CAL HOMO MILK 93* 

CAL LOW FAT MILK $ 15 7  
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DISCUSSING RESULTS--Doug Bale*, left, and Jerry Wenmoh* look 
over tome of the papers collected during the Blackwater Valley Soil 
Conservation District meeting at the Muleshoe City Hall Thursday 
morning.

state leaves the decision on 
location entirely to commission­
ers courts.

The minister said the com­
missioners court, in rescinding a 
previous commitment for the 
location of the new paved road 
carries the full responsibility for 
the hard feelings in south Bailey 
County, and suggested that a 
part of the responsibility lies 
with the citizens of the area 
themselves.

To conclude the meeting 
with the Bula people, Commis­
sioner Moraw said he would 
continue with the road approved 
bv the Bailev Countv Commis­
sioners, which is the ‘west road’ 
and he would continue acquiring 
right of ways prior to construc­
tion of the pavement.

In other commissioner ac­
tion, bids will be sought on a 
mini-bus for use of senior 
citizens, with bids to be opened 
on June 5 and approval was 
given to put new tires on a 
Bailey County Sheriff’s office 
car.

According to an attorney 
General Ruling received by 
Judge Williams, he said jailers 
do not have to be paid the same 
salary as law enforcement of­
ficers and in fact, may be paid a 
lower salary.

Cancer Society 
To Sponsor

Training Session
\

LEVELLAND—A breast cancer 
detection training session for 
registered and licensed voca­
tional nurses is scheduled June 
S at South Plains College.

The session will be sponsor­
ed by the American Cancer 
Society and is set from noon to 
1:30 p.m. in SPC’s Sundown 
Room.

Dr. Bill L. McCullouch of 
Levelland will conduct the train­
ing session, assisted by Dr. P.A. 
Wilmon, chairman of the Hockly 
County unit of the ACS and 
Joyce Williams, Martha Wil­
liams and Helen Brown, R.N.’s.

Awbrey Rawls will give the 
introduction and welcome.

Comptroller
Officers Will 
Visit Here

AUSTIN-State Comptroller 
Bob Bullock announced he is 
sending a representative from 
his Lubbock office to Muleshoe 
on Tuesday, June 13th to assist 
local taxpayers and answer 
questions about state taxes.

Bullock said Enforcement 
Officer Johnny Lacewell will 
meet with local taxpayers at the 
Muleshoe Court House from 2 
p.m. to 4 p.m.

“ If Muleshoe-area merch­
ants, or anyone else for that 
matter, have any questions a- 
bout state taxes or need help in 
preparing tax forms, Mr. Lace­
well will be there to assist 
them,” Bullock said.

“ We’re trying to cut the red 
tape in this office and we believe 
these face-to-face sessions with 
taxpayers help do just that,” 
Bullock added.

Bullock reminded those tax­
payers who are unable to meet 
with his representative on June 
13th that they can still get their 
questions answeres quickly by 
calling his TOLL-FREE tax in­
formation number in Austin. 
That number is 1-800-252-5555.

The Lubbock office, headed 
by Donald F. Paxton, serves 
Lubbock and surrounding coun­
ties.

Rain...
Cont. from Page 1

Foster Fertilizer said ap­
proximately three fourths of an 
inch had fallen in the Lazbuddie 
community, with the rain con­
tinuing late Friday afternoon.

Jerry Ray, from east of 
Circleback, near the Lamb 
County line, said .3 to one half 
inch was received on his farms 
in a Wednesday night rain, and 
more was reported Wednesday 
to the north of Circleback.

All was not beneficial rain 
however, a* Wednesday night, 
hail but a vicious path through a 
recatangular area from Highway 
214 seven miles south of Mule­
shoe to FM2497 west of 214, 
back to 298 at Circle back and to 
Needmore.

Both extensive flood damage 
and hail damage was reported in 
that area. Bailey County Exten­
sion Agent Spencer Tanksley 
went to the area Friday morn­
ing, but was unable to check 
much due to the flooding of 
roads there.

He said young crops were 
washed out and hailed out, and 
many playa lakes were overflow­
ing.

Water will be creating a 
problem for farmers from the 
standpoint of seeding disease in 
cottone resulting in a loss of 
cotton stands, he added. Road 
conditions in that area are poor 
and farmers will be trying to 
save what he has established. 
Some replanting will be done, 
added the county agent.

Tanksley said he would cau­
tion farmers to review their hail 
damage closely before deciding 
to plow up their crops and plant 
over, and said most of the 
damaged cotton in the Progress 
area to the county line had been

Commissioners 
Meet Tuesday In  
Special Session

The Bailey County Commis­
sioner's Court will meet in 
Special Session at their regular 
meeting place in the courthouse 
Tuesday June 6, 1978.

The meeting will begin at 
9:30 A.M., and will continue 
until 5:00 P.M. with the follow­
ing items on the Agenda: Re­
ceive bids for the purchase of a 
Van to be used by the Senior 
Citizens of Bailey County: Re­
ceive bids for paving streets, 
parking lots, and other areas 
around the Bailey County Ex­
hibition Center and Coliseum.; 
Miscellaneous items. I »

The public is urged to attend 
the meeting and to be heard.
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replanted from a storm last 
week.

Corn was not replanted and 
there was a light amount of 
replanting to grain sorghum.

It is misery enough to 
have once been happy. 

-John Clarke.

C u ltn c ■ HI -  COTTON'" FOLIAR 
SPRAT FOR M AXIM U M  YIELDS

A  balanced blend of NP8K and important chelated 
micro-nutrients in a fermentation soluble that are 
easily absorbed by the foliage of the cotton plant. 
Ask your RIVERSIDE man ! He carries a complete 
line of C u f ta c . products including specially 
formulated products for cotton, corn, milo, peanuts 
and others, he’ll also tell you about our easy field 
applied seed treatment products and about the 

I test conducted in West Texas last year,

Ask Your RIVERSIDE Man
. a:i1.1 n ti u . r»-. . f •n -

Riverside 
Chemical Co.

Morwtoctu,*d by

T r a n s A g r a  C o r p o r a tio n
MemptUs. tenneues 38136 U SA.
A MjtoUdkxy ol Ta*a» G «  tommteion Capoftflon

Hwy. 64 -M a lv s k o t-272-4103

i f r
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Rate Savings Plan Minimum Annual

Yield*
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7.50% 4 Year C ertifica te 1,000 7.79%

6.75% 2% Y earC ertifica te 1x000 6.98%

6.50% 1 Year Certificate 1x000 6.72%

5.25% Regalar Passbook 10 5.39%

*When interest is accumulated and compounded. On certificate 
amounts withdrawn prematurely, federal regulations require 
interest reduction to passbook rate and forfeiture of up to 90 days' 
interest.
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Miss Cargile, Barnes 
Repeat Nuptial Vows

MR. AND MRS. MARK BARNES (NEE KAREN CARGILE)

Y-L4H
Meeting

The Y-L 4-H Club met May 
23, in the 16th Ave. D Church of 
Christ. President, Todd Holt, 
called the meeting to order. Joe 
Bob Newman lead the 4-H club 
motto, Karen Kelton lead the 
pledge of Allegiance, Brenda 
Flowers led the 4-H prayer, and 
Tamara Gilliland called the roll 
and read the minutes of the 
previous meeting. A report of 
leather craft was given by 
Brenda Flowers. Tamara Gilli­
land gave the report on Method 
Demonstrations and Perry Flow­
ers gave a report on the council 
meeting.

There will be a record book 
clinic on May 26, at the Mule- 
shoe State Bank, at 4:00 to 5:30. 
A float for the 4th of July parade 
was discussed. There will be a

cookout and a skateboard party. 
New officers were elected for 
next year. They are as follows 
president, Perry Flowers; vice 
president, Tamara Gilliland; se 
cretary, Brenda Flowers; trea 
surer, Kim Wilson; reporter 
Melissa Wagnon; boy delegate 
Joe Bob Newman; girl delegate 
Brenda Flowers; parliamentar­
ian, David Pruitt; recreation 
chairman, Melissa Wagnon and 
refreshment chairman, Karen 
Kelton.

County Agent, Linda Mul-

If you are wise, laugh.
-Martial.

Attractive summer bags 
are being shown in colorful 
solid linens with matching cot­
ton gingham check linings. 
These washable, reversible 
bags feature removable bam­
boo handles.

lins, supplied recreation. The 
meeting was adjourned.

Members present were: 
Perry Flowers, Glen Flowers, 
Tamara Gilliland, Karen Kel­
ton, Melissa Wagnon, David 
Pruitt, Kim Wilson, Mike Holt, 
Todd Holt and reporter, Brenda 
Flowers.

ICEBERG SIGHTED
LONDON -  An iceberg 36 

times the sire of Bermuda and 
inhabited by penguins was 
reported to be drifting slowly 
in the South Atlantic from the 
Antarctic towards the coast of 
Africa. The iceberg was 
observed by scientists aboard 
the British Antarctic survey 
ship John Biscoe.

Miss Karen Cargile, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Preston 
Cargile. of Lazbuddie, and Mark 
Barnes, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Sam Barnes, of Lazbuddie, ex­
changed vows in a double ring 
ceremony at the Primitive Bap­
tist Church, in Muleshoe, 
March 2, at 7:00 p.m. with Elder 
Bernard Gowens, officiating.

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a floor 
length gown of silk, designed 
with a high raised bodice, and 
rounded neckline designed with 
seed pearls. The long fitted 
sleeves were overlayed with 
seed pearls at the wrists. The 
skirt formed a cathedral train, 
and the veil was a tier illusion, 
bordered with lace and with 
seed pearls and lace on the 
crown. The bridal bouquet was a 
nosegay of yellow roses and 
white daisies.

Maid of honor was Cassan­
dra Cargile, sister of the bride. 
She was attired in a formal gown 
of pale yellow. A sheer cape 
collar was worn over the dress,

Sign Of Age 
Hardening of the heart 

ages people more quickly 
than hardening of the 
arteries.

-Citizen. Prichard, Ala.

Muleshoe Hobby 
Club Meets

The Muleshoe Hobby Club 
met Thursday June 1st, at the 
Muleshoe State Bank Reception 
Room, with the following 12 
members present: Myrtle Ch- 
ambless. Mae Loyd, Hallie Bris­
coe, Ethel Julian, Mabel Cald­
well, Terina Pitts, Sammie Eth­
ridge, Opal Robinson, Tina 
Davis. Bernice Amerson, Ruth 
Williams and hostess, Dara 
Phipps.

The hostess gift of stationery 
in a chest was won by Tina 
Davis.

Articles on display were: 
pictures taken in the North east, 
silk roses in a gold vase, antique 
wooden yarn bobbins made into 
a candle holder, antique washer 
plunger used in washing cloth­
es, and a horse head pillow 
made of carpet.

For the hostess at the next 
meeting Myrtle Chambless ex­
changed time with Hallie Bris­
coe. The Club will have an all 
day meeting on Thursday, June 
30th.

The hostess served refresh­
ments of ice cream, pops, nuts, 
cake and coffee.

and the skirt ended with sheer 
flounces of the same color.

Bridesmaids were Elaine 
Cargile. sister of the bride, and 
Sharon Wrinkle, Midland. They 
were attired in formal gowns the 
same as the maid of honor, with 
matching bouquets.

Best man was Monte Barn­
es, of Bovina, brother of the 
groom. Groomsmen were David 
Favor, of Friona, and Ronnie 
Barnes, of Lubbock, brother of 
the groom.

The flower girl was Becky 
Barnes, niece of the groom, and 
ringbearer was Trae Hinkson, 
nephew of the groom.

Pianist for the ceremony was

Mrs. Pat Watson and soloist 
was Debbie Menefee. Dana 
McDonald registered the 
guests.

The reception was held at 
the Muleshoe State Bank Recep­
tion Room following the cere­
mony.

The couple will reside in 
Samnorwood, after returning 
from their wedding trip to 
Oklahoma.

The rehearsal dinner was 
given by the parents of the 
groom at the La Villa Banquet 
Room in Clovis. The bridesmaid 
luncheon was given the day of 
the wedding in the home of Mrs. 
Harvey Bass, of Muleshoe.

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED -Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd H. Carrel], of 
Roswell, N. M., announce the engagement and forthcoming 
marriage of their daughter, Cynthia, to Robert David Stovall, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. David Stovall, Jr., of Muleshoe. The wedding is 
planned for August 12, at 4:00 p.m. at the N.M. Military Institute 
Chapel. Miss Carrell is a 1976 graduate of Goddard High School, 
and is a Junior at New Mexico State University, majoring in finance. 
Robert is a 1975 graduate of Muleshoe High School and is a senior 
at New Mexico State University, majoring in Agricultural 
Economics.

4-H Project Completed

SEPTEMBER WEDDING PLANNED—Wedding plans are
announced for Vicki Watkins, daughter of Mrs. Jackie Denham, of 
Earth, and the late Ralph Denham; to Daniel Scott May, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Donald T. May of Muleshoe. The bride-elect is a 1975 
graduate of Springlake-Earth High School and is currently 
employed as a Respiratory Therapist at Est Plains Medical Center in 
Muleshoe. May is a 1971 graduate of Notre Dame High School in 
Wichita Falls, and attended Texas Tech University. He is co-owner 
and manager of Decorators Nursery and Floral. The Couple plan a 
September 16 wedding at 7:30 p.m., in the First Baptist Church, of 
Earth.

The Muleshoe 4-H Leather- 
craft groups completed their 
projects on My 22. The work­
shops were held in the Bailey 
County Electric Community 
Room under the direction of 
Weldon Stevenson.

The 17 member beginner 
group met on Monday nights at 
7:00. This group studied the 
various tools used in leather- 
craft. They transferred a design 
to coasters and used a swivel 
knife in cutting the design into 
the leather.

The members of the begin­
ner group were: Darin Albert­
son, Jodi Burgess, Mitch Black, 
Tisha Cox, Martin Green, Ther­
esa Green, Rachelle Hard age, 
Devin Harris, Jayna Harris, 
Zanna Huckabee. Laurie Kin- 
ard, Ronnie Logsdon, Michelle 
Logsdon, Heather Merritt, Kim

Merritt, Michelle Stevenson, 
Kristi Taylor and Tim Said, 
student leader.

The advanced group meet on 
Monday nights at 8:00. Their 
leathercraft project was tooling 
a belt with their name on it. 
Members of the advanced group 
were: Justin Helton, Mandy 
Plank, Tim Said and Shelley 
Sain.

*  •  *  *

The trouble with 
spring gardens is summer 
grass.

Explained
The lovely steno­

grapher explained the 
new office machine in this 
fashion: “ It will do the 
work of three men or one 
girl.”

-Baptist Courier.
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r Frame & Art !
High Winds-Clovis

Sponsors
W m. Henry Earle

Workshop
June 12-16

Sunday 
June 11

Lecture-Demonstration 
Kingswood Methodist Fellowship Hall 

Main A Yucca 
(North Entrance)

A d  mission: $3.00 1:
Painting To Bo Givon Awa)

SPECIAL GROUP
MENS KNIT SHIRTS

s

VAL TO $16 .9 9

SPECIAL GROUP
PRINTED T-SHIRTS

100% POLYESTER
DOUBLE KNITS 

$ 1 6 7  2 YDS *
I  RIG $ 1 .4 7 1 $2 .97  YD

DOUBLE KNIT CLEAN UP

SEPTEMBER WEDDING ANNOUNCED- Mrs. W.E. Meyers, of
Muleshoe, and L.R. Watson, of Lubbock, announce the engagement 
and approaching marriage of their daughter, Winn, to Charles A 
Cantwell, of Austin. Vows will be solemnized at the First United 
Presbyterian Church, in Austin, on September 2, 1978.

M IN S  _
FASHION)
DENIM

How The West Is Worn
For Fathers Day

S t i l t V g t M »

Use Our layaway Plan

, w  Sess W E S T E R N  W E A R

Opaa Moa.-Sat. 9 a .w .-6 p .m .
1910 W Amor.Blvd. 272-4663
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■ DACRON F IL tiP
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2 FOR$l

MENS DRESS 
SHOES BYRORERTS

s  s 2 3 ”  „ » «
I  SLIP ON  OR LACE TAN, *
I  B R O W N ,  B L A C K , B O N E ,

E b LUE REG 126.99 TO $31.99

REG
$ 7 .4 4

% %
*1 sricijuc

PURCHASE
FLORAL 

TOWEL SETS
3 PC $5



Miss McFarland Honored 
With Bridal Shower
Miss Claire McFarland, 

bride-elect of Scott Brown, was 
honored with a Come and Go 
bridal shower, Fri., May 26 at 
3:00 in the home of Mrs. Demp 
Foster, of Lazbuddie.

Special guests were Mrs. 
Bobbie McFarland, mother of 
the bride-elect, of Farwell; Mrs.

TOPS Club
Hold* Meeting

The TOPS Club met Thurs­
day, June 1st with 21 members 
present. The weekly queen was 
Mrs. Nan Gatlin. First runner 
up was Mrs. Lavayne Williams, 
and second runners up were 
Mrs. Bula Gatewood and Mrs. 
Glynn Stroud.

The monthly queen was 
Mrs. Ronald Patton with first 
runner up being Mrs. Buria 
Vinson, and second runner up 
Mrs. Bula Gatewood. The KOPS 
Queen was Mrs. Raleigh Ma­
son. ,  ,

Mrs. Nan Gatlin, Mrs. Bula 
Gatewood, and Mrs. Raleigh 
Mason received material for 
three weeks consecutive weight 
loss. Mrs. Nan Gatlin drew the 
Can-Can and she accepted.

Side I will perform for Side □ 
at the next meeting. All mem­
bers are asked to be present. 
Also at the next meeting Mrs. 
Dana Arnold will give a pep 
talk.

The Meeting was dismissed 
with the singing of the good­
night song.

Fern Christian, grandmother of 
the bride-elect, of Farwell; and 
Mrs. Flo Brown, mother of the 
groom, of Lazbuddie.

The bride-elect’s color of 
lavendar was carried out in 
orchid corsages presented to the 
honoree and special guests. The 
serving table featured a multi­
colored arrangement of silk 
flowers. Assorted cookies and 
punch were served to the 
guests.

The hostess gifts were a 
Faberware Grill and Faberware 
Coffee Pot.

Hostesses were: Mrs. Glen 
Scott, Mrs. Kenneth Precure, 
Mrs. Randy Bush, Mrs. Bernard 
Phelps, Mrs. Robert Gallman, 
Mrs. Raymond Treider, Jr., 
Mrs. David Anderson, Mrs. 
Jerry Don Glover, Mrs. W. G. 
Harlan, Mrs. Bob Jones, Mrs. 
Max Steinbock. Mrs. Tim Fos­
ter, Mrs. Gene Smith, Mrs. 
Irvin St. Clair, Mrs. Demp 
Foster, and Mrs. Mildred Lam­
bert.
*  '• |

* — Always Late
“ Helen's plane gets in at

four-thirty.”
"Well, I’ll be at the airport 

at five-thirty.”
“ Five-thirty?”
“Yes: Helen is always an 

hour late, whatever she 
does.”

Domestic Dynamite
“ What caused the explo­

sion at your house last night?” 
“ Powder on my sleeve.”

$ -N O T IC E -
it In order to give our employees 

some extra time to spend with 
their families, our offices will 

be closed on Saturdays 
throughout the summer 

months. After hour appointments 
can be arranged in advance.

i

Dr. B.W. Armistead 
Dr. Steven D. Smith
O p t o m e t r i s t s

LFD Drive 385-5147 Littlofiold

LYH Review Busy Year
Bailey County Journal, Sunday June 4, 1978, Page 5

The Lazbuddie Young 
Homemakers held their last 
regular meeting for the year. 
Thursday in the Home Ec. 
Department of the High School. 
A covered dish luncheon was 
enjoyed by those attending. The 
serving table was covered with a 
yellow daisy patterned cover. 
Yellow and white daisy paper- 
ware was used. A yellow candle 
with a daisy candle ring graced 
the center of the table.

A brief business meeting 
was held following the meal. 
Thank You’s were read from 
Mrs. Kirby Burch and Mrs. 
Betty Bewley. Mrs. Jim Collum 
read a letter concerning the 
State Young Homemakers Con­
vention which is to be held in 
Waco, Tx., January 26-27, 1979. 
Members were reminded that 
State Young Homemakers Week 
will be September 17-23, 1978. 
A list of six Seniors names were 
presented the members by Mrs. 
Clay Mimms that the faculty 
had selected for a $100 scholar­
ship to be given by the Young 
Homemakers. From this list one 
name was selected. The recipi­
ent is to be Miss Kim LaRue.

New Officers for the coming 
year 1978-79 were elected. They 
are: President, Mrs. Clay 
Mimms, Vice President, Mrs. 
Lloyd Bradshaw, Secretary, 
Mrs. Roy Don Rector, Reporter, 
Mrs. Jim Collum, Historian, 
Mrs. Conrad Renner. New com- 
mitties were also signed up.

Mrs. Jim Collum was pre­
sented with a charm bracelet 
from the members for their

appreciation for her work serv­
ing as President. Mrs. Bill 
Morris, Advisor, was also given 
a gift of jewelery for her 
willingness to always help. Mrs. 
Lloyd Bradshaw and Mrs. Col­
lum then presented a cake 
inscribed, "Thank You All" 
with each members name be­
side a flower to those attending, 
for their dedication and work 
this year.

Members present viewed 
the year’s scrapbook, recalling 
the projects and events of the 
1977-78 year. In September, in 
observance of Young Home­
makers Week, Lazbuddie Young 
Homemakers held a member­
ship Tea featuring Mrs. Ralph 
Wilson, from Friona as guest 
speaker. She gave a delightful 
demonstration on Dough Art. In 
October, we assisted Mrs, 
Robert Owens, School Nurse, in 
giving Eye and Ear Tests to the 
Elementary students. Members 
voted to donate $300 to the 
Lazbuddie Volunteed Fire De­
partment toward the purchase, 
of a Paging System. December 
was a busy and exciting month 
with the Family Christmas Party 
turning out to be a tremendous 
success. Young Homemakers, 
besides baking for the Holiday 
Season, baked goodies and took 
them to the Muleshoe Nursing 
Home. In March, Young Home­
makers donated $100 toward the 
purchase of an X-ray Machine 
through Dr. Gary Albertson to 
be used at the World Gospel 
Mission in Tenwek, Africa. 
April was the month for the 
Annual Spring Show put on by

MR. AND MRS. T.H. CLEM 
...1978

MR. AND MRS. T.H. CLEM 
...1928

5 0 t h  A n n i v e r s a r y  
C e l e b r a t e d  B y  C l e m s

A surprise reception was 
given in honor of Mr. and Mrs. 
T.H. Clem, former residents of 
the Muleshoe Area, Sat. night, 
at the Owens Entertainment 
Center, in observance of the 
couple's 50th Wedding Anniver­
sary.

Troy Clem and Noema Bates 
were married May 20, 1928, in

M a k e  D a d  S m i l e  O n  

F a t h e r s  D a y ,

J u n e  1 8 t h

W i t h  A  G i f t  

F r o m

Albertson’s Shop For
S l l l l r i a 272-3000

the First Methodist Church 
parsonage in Brownwood.

The Anniversary party, host­
ed by the couple's children and 
their families, was held in 
conjunction with the center's 
monthly covered dish dinner.

The Clem children are Mrs. 
Billie Marlow, of Muleshoe, 
Mrs. Dean Morgan, of Austin, 
and Troy Clemm II, of Laguna 
Beach, California. They were 
joined by 150 guests including 
relatives and friends from all 
over the state. An eulogy of 
Troy and Noema was given by 
the Rev. Everett Yielding after 
the evening meal.

The group was entertained^ 
with Fiddle, guitar and piano 
music.

After dinner, the three-tier­
ed cake was cut by the honored 
couple. The table was decorated 
with a yellow and white daisy 
floral arrangement and the 
couple’s original wedding pic­
tures. Photographers. Bill Mor­
gan. the couple's grandson and 
Cliff Whctstine made pictures.

Cake and punch were served 
by Mrs. Deborah Noble and 
Cindy Morgan, granddaughters 
of the honorees. Guests were 
welcomed by Dianne Morgan, 
also a granddaughter of the 
honored couple.

After Troy and Noema open­
ed many gifts, those attending 
joined in singing gospel songs 
with piano music by Mrs. Ever­
ett Yielding.

Ruby Clark, pianist. Ken 
Hazlett, fiddler, and Cliff Whet- 
stine at the electric guitar, 
played old time music.

the Young Homemakers. In 
May a $100 Scholoarship was 
given to Miss Kim LaRue to 
help further her education. The 
F.H.A. girls were honored with 
a Coke Party. The largest and 
most enjoyable project was that 
of the Special Senior Citizens. 
Young Homemakers remember­
ed these Citizens with cards 
each month, special cards on 
Holidays, and their birthdays. 
Fruit baskets were delivered at 
Christmas time to these per­
sons. Then May 9th, an after­
noon social was held in the 
Lazbuddie Cafeteria in their 
honor.

Some of the programs enjoy­
ed by the members this year 
have been: Candy Making and 
Decorating, Holiday Foods, Ho­
liday Foods. Holiday Gift Wrap­

ping. Merle-Norman Make-up 
Demonstration, A Tour of Tri­
angle Home Center in Govis, 
and the Lamaze Method of 
Birth.

Lazbuddie Young Home­
makers would like to thank all 
the people from the Lazbuddie 
and surrounding areas for help­
ing make each of these projects 
possible through their purchas­
es of our Pecan Sales and 
promoting our booths at the 
Halloween Carnival.

Members attending the 
luncheon were: Mrs. Lloyd 
Bradshaw, Mrs. Loy Dale Clark. 
Mrs. Jim Collum, Mrs. Robert 
Gallman, Mrs. Skip Magby, 
Mrs. Darrell Mason, Mrs. Bill 
Morris, Mrs. Clay Mimms, Mrs. 
Roy Don Rector and Mrs. Harrol 
Redwine.

Margaret A. Brewer first 
Marine Corp general.

Mrs Hester Feted With Gift Tea
Mrs. George Owen Hester, 

Jr., the former Carol Brown, 
was honored with a gift tea on 
Wednesday, May 31, at 2:30 in 
the Muleshoe State Bank Com­
munity Room.

The bride's chosen color of 
blue was carried out with an 
arrangement of white daisies 
and blue spider mums on a 
white, lace-trimmed cloth with 
crystal appointments. Cookies, 
punch and nuts were served to 
the guests by Shannon Sowder.

Mrs. Hester was presented 
with a corsage of blue daisies. 
The hostess gift was a set of 
Farberware cookware.

Hostesses were: Mrs. 
George Mayo, Mrs. Harvey 
Bass, Mrs. Ernest Kerr, Mrs. 
Ben Gramling, Mrs. Odell Ras- 
co, Mrs. Neal Dillman, Mrs. 
James Jennings, Mrs. Charles 
Mayhigh, Mrs. Jim Cox, Mrs. 
Cecil Cole, Mrs. Mickey Sow­
der, Mrs. Bill Jim St. Gair,

Mrs. Jimmie Crawford, Mrs. 
Jimmy Skipworth, Mrs. S.M. 
Ethridge and Mrs. Lindal Mur­
ray.

MRS. HESTER

In sewing a dress or skirt, 
the hem allowance depends on 
the type of skirt: a circular 
skirt requires a one-inch hem; 
a flared skirt, two inches; a 
straight skirt, three inches.

Tennis whites are still most 
popular on the tennis court. 
An attractive one is made of 
polyester knit with V-front and 
V-fiack.

Morodith Loa 
W a l l e r

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Walker, of 
Farwell, are the proud parents 
of a new baby girl, bom May 
31, 1978 at 4:48 a.m. in the 
West Plains Medical Center, in 
Muleshoe. The baby weighed 
eight pounds and eight ounces. 
The couple have two other 
children, Marty and Matthew.

Grandparents are: Mr. and 
Mrs. B.C. Locke, of Muleshoe, 
and Mr. and Mrs. E.A. Walker, 
of Farwell.
Guy Wayno Nichols

Mr. and Mrs. Nicky Nickels 
of Muleshoe are the proud 
parents of a new baby boy, bom 
May 26,1978 at 7:15 p.m. in the 
West Plains Medical Center, in 
Muleshoe. The baby weighed 
eight pounds. The couple have 
one other son, Nicky Chad, 2.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Ralph Glover, Mrs. Josie 
Koontz, and Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Nickels, all of Muleshoe. Great 
Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Finis Kimbrough and Mr. and 
Mrs. Guy Nickels, also of Mule-

Tori Michollo  
Williams

Mr. and Mrs. David Wil­
liams, of McCamey, are the 
proud parents of a new baby 
girl, bom May 29, at 6:26 a.m. 
in the Odessa Womens and 
Childrens Hospital. The new 
baby weighed seven pounds and 
12 ounces and was named Teri 
Michelle.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy F. Williams, of

Muleshoe, Mrs. Homer Shiff­
lett, of Levelland, and Stanley 
Sanders, of Levelland.

H as A  Point 
Sign on an out-of-town 

church  b u lle tin  board : 
‘‘Seven days w ithou t 
prayer makes one weak."

-Times, Dallas.

If We Can’t Dress

The O l’Boy No One 
Can!

Froo Gift Wrap With 

$5 Or Moro

St. Clairs
110 Main  272-4453 '

] j j p g f i i

PANTY HOSE
FAMOVS BRAND 

SHEER STRETCH ULTRA SL 
REG REG T /  
$1.95 $3.00 z /
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CHILDRENS
T-SHIRTS
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editorial 
Inflation & Taxes

The dismal news that wholesale prices are increas­
ing far too rapidly makes it clearer than ever little or no 
tax refund is justified this year-even though the 
President and Congress are tempted to vote this goodie 
in an election year.

Further, the current serious inflationary problem 
argues that the federal budget be cut immediately. 
There's no justification for a S500 billion dollar budget 
for the next fiscal year, and another deficit of sixty 
billions, which Congress has just endorsed.

If the country’s best interests are to be served the 
President and Congress must bite the bullet and exhibit 
the courage to curb spending, even if the economy 
slows and there is more statistical unemployment. 
Federal unemployment figures are, incidentally, in 
many cases meaningless, and their accuracy is suspect.

Overspending, rapid inflation, a falling dollar and 
other economic woes facing the nation are real. The 
simple answer is less deficit spending by the federal 
government and modest, if any, tax reduction. Presi­
dent Carter would be wise to take tough, emergency 
action on this front.

Carter & Bureaucrats
President Carter, voicing concern over inflation and 

asking restraint from all Americans on wages and price 
increases, suggested limited federal raises this year to 
5.5 per cent. While admirable in tone and direction, it 
was a minuscule gesture compared to what the 
President could have done concerning the federal 
bureaucratic army.

Elected on the hope that he would reduce the 
bureaucracy. Carter has steadily enlarged it and asked 
for new agencies. He has proposed bigger spending for 
practically all domestic social programs, plus giving his 
own executive department employes two raises 
totaling some thirty per cent since he took office.

The need of the moment is that federal employes, 
already grossly overpaid in most cases, and enjoying 
overly fat pension schemes and other benefits (plus 
almost total security against being fired for incompe­
tency), be denied any pay increase at all in 1978. Even 
more pressing is the need for putting federal employes, 
and military pensioners, under the social security 
pension system and phasing out special privilege re­
tirement systems financed by all the nation's taxpayers.

Social security requires average Americans to work 
ten years before qualifying for partial retirement pay at 
62. Privileged bureaucrats need work (?) only five years 
to get far bigger retirement payments at 55!

It’s simply unfair and undemocratic and Congress 
has already dodged the issue too long-because poten­
tial civil service and military pensioners have a potent 
lobby. Neither can the nation afford to finance this 
special privilege, nor is it justified by democratic 
standards.

_  O W E R
■  B a l k s
by U.S. Senator for Texas

JOHN TOWER

Defined
Platform: Something a 

candidate stands on be­
fore election and falls 
down on afterward.

-Courier, Portsmouth.

TRUTH IN LENDING
The Senate has passed a 

bill that would simplify the 
legalistic mumbo jumbo that 
consumers encounter when 
trying to decipher credit 
terms. f i : r

WASHINGTON NOTES
AID & AMTRAK

The House Interstate and 
Foreign Commerce Committee 
has approved a bill that would 
extend the life of Amtrak pas­
senger trains marked for ex­
tinction by the Transportation 
Department.

NEUTRON FUNDS
The House has overwhelm­

ingly rejected an attempt to 
kill funds for producing neu­
tron warheads. The vote pre­
served President C artel’s

option to go ahead with pro­
duction at some future time.

FILIBUSTER *  LABOR BILL
.  Republican opponents of 

labor law revision have launch­
ed their long-promised fili­
buster against the bill that 
organized labor and the Carter 
administration want so badly.

U.S. BUDGET OK’D
House and Senate negotia­

tors have approved a $498.8 
billion target federal budget 
for fiscal 1979, after reaching a 
compromise on defense versus 
domestic spending.

WORKING WOMEN
The U.S. labor force pass­

ed the 100 million mark in 1977 
with women accounting for 
most of the increase, the Cen­
sus Bureau says. The labor 
force, including military per­
sonnel, increased by some 15 
million from 1970 through 
1977.

SS CARD RULES
The government has order­

ed all persons under 18 years 
old who are applying for a 
Social Security card to begin 
furnishing solid proof of iden­
tity and age.

L a b o r  Reform s?
WASHINGTON— Reform means different things to 

different people.
Most people believe it should stand for change which 

improves our lives or the laws which govern our social 
conduct.

Reform is a popular theme in Washington. Attach it to 
any piece of legislation and it automatically carries with 
it redeeming social or economic value.

Reform as it has been applied to the so-called Labor 
Law Reform Act ol 1978, however, is so much malarkcy. 
This legislation is not reform in any sense of the word, 
and the Senate now is engaged in extended debate to 
separate truth from myth.

Those who favor changes in the National Labor Rela­
tions Act claim the only result would be modest improve­
ments in prtx.edures governing collective bargaining.

Those of us in the Senate leadership opposed to this 
bill recognize it for what it really is: not a modest meas­
ure to improve procedures in labor-management at all, but 
a shrewdly calculated attempt by organized labor to load 
the dice against business—particularly small business— 
while making union membership the prerequisite for em­
ployment. In effect, George Meany would become the 
Personnel Director for every business across the country.

In Texas, our strong right-to-work laws have always 
ensured worker freedoms at the place of employment. 
Texans enjoy the right to choose whether or not union 
membership is their cup of tea. That’s the way Texans 
want it. and that’s the way it should be nationwide.

If this legislation passes, it won’t be.
Even a very basic review of the legislation suggests that 

much more is involved. About the only procedures that 
woidd he streamlined would be those working to confer 
special privilege on big labor unions—particularly to 
speed up union representation elections.

Of special concern to me in opposing this legislation is 
that employees would have diminished rights of free 
choice about whether or not they should join a union.

Moreover, the balance of rights between labor and man­
agement so painstakingly written into current law would 
be lopsidedly weighted in favor of unions. Wage and bene­
fit settlements under this legislation could be determined 
by the Federal government on the basis of nationwide 
statistics, regardless of the size of business involved.

Those companies who “willfully violate” the law would 
be "blacklisted” from receiving Federal contracts for a 
period of three years, yet another example of the drastic 
change in the nature of the law under this proposed bill 
from a remedial one to a punitive one.

Such punitive actions against small businesses, the back­
bone of our economic vitality, would squeeze the life­
blood out of all those small concerns which rely on gov­
ernment contracts for survival.

Combine these provisions with the bill’s recognized in­
flationary impact, which economists have said would add 
4-5% to consumer prices in Texas for each 10% increase 
in labor force unionization, and the result is bad legisla­
tion which would make even worse law.

“Reforms” of this kind Texans don't want or need.

WASHINGTON 
NEWS REPORT

A Long Debate- 
Carter k  Union*- 
Congress k  Foreign Policy

WASHINGTON, D. C. - 
The Senate seems destined for 
many weeks of filibuster over 
the attempt to pass what is 
called a labor reform bill. 
Though the bill might have 
other good features, its objec­
tionable feature is that it 
would also force workers to 
join unions to keep their jobs 
in some cases.

Unions contributed per­
haps $25,000,000 to the 
Carter-Mondale campaign last 
year, in all forms. This is the 
bill George Meany feels is the 
payoff. (Unions have already 
won a higher minimum wage 
bill.) President Carter has 
endorsed the bill and Vice 
President Mondale recently 
told union heads the Carter 
Administration would fulfill 
the “ trust and faith" placed in 
them.

But a group of about forty 
Senators, mostly Republicans, 
is filibustering. This being an 
election year for all House 
members, little hope had been 
expressed for rejection in the 
House, where it recently 
passed.

If the feature of the 
“ reform" bill requiring non­
union-workers to join unions to 
keep their jobs were deleted, 
the bill could almost certainly 
be passed. But unions have 
not been gaining membership, 
overall, in recent years and 
this, to them, is an important

feature of the bill.
For Carter, this is 1978's 

major Senate battle number- 
three. He won on the Panama 
Canal and Mideast arms sales, 
but Congress has received 
more mail on this issue than 
any other. The National Right 
to Work Committee, in nearby 
fairfax, Virginia, has seen to 
that.

Some solons now admit 
Congress stuck its nose too far 
into foreign relations guidance 
in the post-Vietnam war era. 
Congress so hamstrung U.S. 
Presidents Mr. Carter finds 
himself unable to provide 
covert aid to African regimes 
fighting for survival against 
Cuban-led rebels. France is 
doing a better job than the 
U.S., in this respect.

Did You Know??
Treflan Is Now Cleared
For Post Plant Weed

Control In Corn!!
We Have The Knowledge On 

This Process, And The 
Equipment To Apply

Treflan For You.
Let Us Help You Solve

— n , « Your Watergrass 
Problem.

Call Today
272-4556

F O R  T H O S E  W H O  R E A L L Y  
A P P R E C IA T E  G O O D  TASTE

Charmglow 
Electric Grill

The great American cook-out is for kids of 
all ages . . . those who really appreciate 
and enjoy the tantalizing aroma and rich 
flavor of food cooked outdoors. Electric 
barbequing with the Charmglow Electric 
Grill is tasty, economical and more 
convenient than any form of outdoor or 
indoor cooking. Just plug it in and set the 
dial. Barbequing with Charmglow is an 
adventure in great taste . . . your's and 
their's.

S A V E  O N  IN S ID E  C O O L I N G  
C O S T S ! C O O K  O U T S ID E !

Western "66  ” Company
Earth Hwy-Muleshoe

CART MODEL PATIO BASE 
MODEL

$162°° *148°°
PLUS TAX PLUS TAX

S O U T H W E S TE R N  PU B LIC  SE R V IC E
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SAVINGS

Now At 
First National

Bank

FIRSTNATIONAL BANK will offer you a new high-yielding 
savings plan. A new SavingsCertificate with a sixmonth 
maturity."

1 10,000 minim urn forsixmonthsallowsyou toeam the high 
end of the interests paid on savings heretofore earned only by 
large investors.

The rate you will earnisbased on thesixmonth treasurybill 
rate that is in effect at the time you invest your savings...and this 
rateis guaranteed regardlessof the money market.

*• penalty for early withdrawel

CALL OR COME BY AND SEE U S FOR DETAILS... 
ITS ALL NEW AND COM ING TO THE 

FIRSTNATIONAL BANK
OFMULESHOE !!

Save At Home

Home
Owned
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Lazbuddie
News

By J id y  Lest

The third grade class of 
| Lazbuddie had a contest to see 
| who could make the most 100's 

on their weekly Spelling Test.
Mrs. Briggs gave prizes to the 
first and second place winners. 

I Traci Elliott won first place with 
the most 100's and Shonda 

| Mitchell was second.
• * • • •

Students making all A's 
were Kristine Miller, and Traci 
Elliott had all A's and one B. 
Dusty Jesko and Shonda 
Mitchell had all A's plus some 

I B’s.
• • • • •

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Briggs 
I of Lazbuddie, visited her 
mother, Mrs. H.W. Carpenter, 
in Lubbock, last weekend. Her 
mother had been in the hospital,

I but now is at home.
• • • • •

Jana Briggs had an eighth 
I grade girls slumber party after 
I graduation. Those attending 
I were Cara Smith, Susan Glover,
I Gay Elliott, Sheri Templar, Kim 
|Gregory and Trestia Moors.

* • * • •
SCHOOLS OUT!! School let 

I out last Thursday for the sum­
mer. Eigth grade graduation 
was held that same night, and 
High School Graduation was 

| held May 22.

Mr. and Mrs. Harroll Red- 
I wine and family are enjoying a 
few days vacation at Six Flags 
this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Dewayne Sex- 
I ton are in Henrietta visiting his 
] mother.

The Jr. Class is spending the 
| week water skiing at Ute Lake 

•  • • • •
The Children’s Program for 

| the Methodist Bible School will 
be held Sunday night at 7:00 at 

| the Methodist Church.
• • • • •

Several young people are 
| competing in the Summer Track 

Program. Their first track meet 
will be Sat. in Amarillo.

• * • • •
A group of people went to 

White Sands and went sand 
surfing last Saturday.

............
Congratulations to Mr. and 

Mrs. Tim Smith and Mr. and 
Mrs. Nicky Nickels on the birth 
of their new babies. Kimberly 
Joy Smith, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Tim Smith was born 
Monday, May 22, and weighed

1975 CHEV. PICKUP 6 Cylinder, Standard Transmission, AM
Radio, Stereo -8  Track, C.B., Tool Box Air Conditioning. Low Miles.

1975 FORD LTD BROUGHAM 4 Door, Vinyl Top, Air

Conditioned, Radio. Low Miles, Less Than 26,000. Speed Control.

only $2,695.00

$3,495.00

THIRD GRADE WINNERS--Winners of T-shirts in the recent MS Read-A-Thon conducted at Mary 
DeShazo school are from left, standing, Geraldine Lewis, Michael Engeley, Mona Gark and Lori Kinard; 
and kneeling from left, Maria Sayago, Brent Black and Jernardo Gonzales.

View From 
The Plains

by J.D. Peer 
I S  E Fi*Id Officer

7 lbs. 8 Ozs. Guy Wayne Nickels, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Nicky 
Nichols was born Friday.May 
26, and weighed 8 lbs.

*****
Danny Howard, from Hous­

ton, visited here last week for 
graduation. His grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Deboe Carpenter 
are now in Houston attending 
his graduation.

ONE MINUTE SPORTS QUIZ
1. Who won the New Orleans 
Open Golf Tournament?
2. How many times has Cale 
Yarborough won the NASCAR 
Grand National point cham­
pionship?
3. What do Tom Owens of 
Portland, Brian Winters and 
Alex English of Milwaukee 
have in common?
4. Who won the Alan King 
Tennis Classic?
5. Name the winner of the 
LPGA Lady Tara Golf Tourna­
ment.

Answers to Sports Qniz
1. Lon Hinkle.
2. Two times.
3. They all played college 
basketball at the University of 
South Carolina.
4. Harold Solomon.
5. Janet Coles.

LUBBOCK-Many people are 
enjoying the springtime on 
picnics, while fishing, or, just 
hiking in Texas, but young 
wildlife can be harmed if picked 
up or handled by the well-mean­
ing individual.

The best reason to leave 
wildlife alone is state laws 
governing the possession, sale 
or barter, and confinement of 
both game and non-game ani­
mals, birds and endangered 
species such as the Homed 
toad.

Capturing young wildlife in 
the wild results in problems for 
both the person possessing the 
wildlife and the Texas Parks and 
Wildlife Department.

Many times, serious, unex­
pected problems arise from 
unqualified attempts to domest­
icate creatures which nature 
intended to be wild and free.

Most people attempting to 
pen or confine these young of 
the wild do so with a sense of 
compassion for the apparent

“ lost” animal or bird. In 
reality, the parent or parents are 
most likely near by watching as 
you handle or even injure their 
young. Some wild parents will 
not accept their offspring back if 
human scent is left on the 
young.

Opportunities for the wildlife 
young to learn to survive in the 
out-of-doors is lost if not taught 
by their natural parents. These 
birds and animals fail to learn 
who their natural enemies are 
and how to defend themselves 
against attack.

Both “ well-meaning” adults 
and children are often bitten by 
the wild “ pets” in captivity and 
usually it is the children receiv­
ing the worst of the deal. Some 
wild animals and birds carry 
harmful or deadly diseases such 
as virus, ticks, tetanus, or 
tularemia which can be transfer­
red to humans or domestic pets.

Information about what to do 
with wildlife “ pets” is available 
by contacting your nearest 
Texas game warden or any 
P&WD office. ■ — —
. '!• • ! . , ' •  •riiioC’

Pleasure n iu sf<T!e p u r i  
chased with the price 
of pain.

-George Pettie.

AUTHORIZED DEALER: CLASSIC VANS

Save At The

First National

1 A / A  I t A I M I E  f M A f l  T D l i r i f  1 */2 Ton' 4 SPeed '  6 C/Iinder Engine, Hoist, 
IY O O  V U U U C  1 W W  I K U I A  12 ft. Bed, Only 25,000 Miles. Red.

1 Q A O  m i  I f  If  2 Door' Hard Top, Skylark. Very Nice. Air Condition,
1 I W I V l l  power Steering, Automatic.

1973 DODGE PICKUP 360, Automatic Transmission, Power Steering,
Air Conditioning. Camper Topper. New Tires on it.

r *K SPEC IAL

*  1978 Dodge Adventurer Special Edition
400 Engine D— 150 Demonstrator Canyon Red and White

List Price

$ 7 , M l .

Sale Price

$6,561.61

*1,195.00

*1,995.00

Tint Glass 
Air Condition 
Grip Rails 
Steel Belt Radial 

^ ^ w c ^ T o n e ^ a m H U

2 Gas Tonks 
Auto Speed Control 
Rear Hitch
Premium Wheel Covers 
Stab. Bar.

GARLAND
CHRYSLER, PLYMOUTH A DODGE

A

720 E. 3rd. Littlefield 385-4454
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CROSSWORD
rr

ACROSS
1-Competent 
5-Towel marking 
9-Pay .... to (woo)

11- Prayer word . -
12- American president -"-Fannmg need

2 wds.
15- Common abbr.
16- Stuff
17- Wrath
18- Complete
20- Meat dish
21- “ .. You Like It”
22- Family member
23- Diplomacy 
26-Given help 
29-Girl’s name

30- Receptacle 10-Does office wort
31- Very long time 13-Sailor
33-American presi- 14-... Delhi

dent: 2 wds. 19-Have a snack
36-Nothing else than 20-Doleful

22-Asia .....
38- Eskimo asset 23-... Mahal
39- .... sugar 24-American
DOWN president
1- Have a hurt 25-Beast of burden
2- Vessels 26-Weapon
3- Stagger 27-Strange
4- Blunder 28-"Lorna .......”
5- Difficult 30-Type of car
6- Big bird 32-Snug abode
7- Send money 34-Sooner than
8- Hunt hares 35-Arrest

Optometrists Are Studying New Regulations
A spokesman for the Texas 

Optometric Association said to­
day: “The Federal Trade Com­
mission's new rule, just announ­
ced, contains three major 
points.
“ On the preemption of state 
laws prohibiting the advertising 
of opthalmic goods and profes­
sional services, we feel that the 
FTC action is unnecessary. 
State laws banning such price 
advertising became unenforce­
able eleven months ago, by 
virtue of the U.S. Supreme 
Court decision in Bates vs. State 
Bar of Arizona regarding adver­
tising by lawyers.
“ On the restriction of informa­
tion which state legislatures 
may require advertisers to in­
clude in their ads, we feel this 
restricts the consumer's right to 
information and violates the 
right of the states to regulate 
health care in the public inter­
est.”

Jose San Martin HI. O.D., 
San Antonio, president of the 
Texas Optometric Association, 
said: "The third major point in 
the FTC rule requires ophthal­
mologists and optometrists 
automatically to release eye­

glass and contact lens prescrip­
tions to every patient without 
additional charge. We recognize 
the patient’s right to a written 
copy of his or her eyeglass 
prescription. But we are strong­
ly opposed to a requirement that 
the doctor release the written 
contact lens prescription to 
every patient. This creates a 
hazardous situation for some 
people that may lead to damage 
to the patient’s eyes.”

Dr. San Martin said,"Con- 
tact lenses should have precise 
fit. Even a slight deviation from 
the written prescription can 
cause the lens to fit incorrectly. 
This can impair normal tear 
flow, depriving the eyes of 
needed oxygen; can affect com­
fort and possibly clearness of 
vision; of cause the lens to 
scratch the eye, making the eye 
susceptible to irritation by infec­
tion or damage. The patient’s 
protection has been and is our 
concern.”

The American Optometric 
Association is filing a lawsuit 
against the Federal Trade Com­
mission regarding its new rule 
on the advertising of ophthalmic 
goods and professional services.

AOA is also challenging the 
FTC’s requirement in the con­
tact lens area. The AOA states it 
is taking this action because it 
feels strongly that parts of the 
rule are not in the best interest 
of the consumer, and there is 
also concern that FTC is over­
stepping its powers as a regu­
latory agency.

Golden Gleams
Pleasure is the most real 

good in this life.
-Frederick The Great.

Do not bite at the bait of 
pleasure till you know 
there is no hook 
beneath it.

-Thomas Jefferson.

Consider not pleasures 
as they come, but as 
they go.

-H.G. Bohn.

The great pleasure in life 
is doing what people 
say you cannot do.

•Walter Bagehot.

ANSWERS ACROSS ANSWERS DOWN
1-Able 22-Ma 1-Ache 20-Sad
5-Hers 23-Tact 2-Boats 22-Minor
9-Court 26-Aided 3-Lurch 23-Taj

11-Amen 29-Ada 4 Err 24-Adams
12-Harry Truman 30-Urn 5-Hard 25-Camel
15-Etc. 31-Eon 6-Emu 26-Arm
16-Pad 33-James Monroe 7-Remit 27-Eerie
17-ire 36-Mere 8-Snare 28-Doone
18-Sheer 37-Rains \ 10-Types 30-Used
20-Stew 38-Sled 13-Tar 32-Nest
21-As 39-Beet 14-New 

19-Eat
34- Ere
35- Nab

FIFTH GRADE WINNERS-Students from the fifth grade at DeShaze Elementary who were presented
T-shirts following the recent MS read-A-Thon included from left, standing, Betsy Lunsford, Kristi Spies 
and Frankie Sayago and kneeling, from left, Polly Harrison and Louise Lopez.

Hail Damaged Corn \ 
Sorghum May Survive

0* Wall Street
By Bob Hilt

COLLEGE STATION -Foul 
weather with hail often runs 
rampant over Texas during the 
spring, causing widespread crop 
damage. This puts many farm­
ers in a quandary about what to 
do with their damaged crops- 
leave them or replant?
"When assessing damage to 
com and sorghum, there are a 
number of factors for producers 
to consider,” points out Dr. 
John Bremer, agronomist with 
the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service. “ However, prob­
ably of most importance is the 
condition of the growing tips of 
damaged plants."

Other factors in assessing 
crop damage include stand re­
duction, leaf loss, yeed and 
insect control and the calendar 
date. Also, local growing condi­
tions and alternative crops enter 
into the final decision-making, 
notes the agronomist.

“ As far as com is concerned, 
producers must first determine 
the number and distribution of 
plants remaining alive,” advis­
es Bremer. “To do this, they 
must check the growing point 
closely for damage. The grow­
ing point remains below the 
ground for two to three weeks 
after the plant emerges. Also, it 
is in the center of the stalk so 
that it has some protection from 
injury. If the growing point is 
not damaged (it is white and 
firm when healthy), com will 
recover and perform better than 
when replanted.”

The agronomist suggests 
that producers also check com 
plants to determine if they are 
“buggy whipped,” or the leaves 
bound in the whorl. These 
plants may recover but should 
not be considered as living when 
making the plant count.

“ As with com, sorghum 
should be checked for damage 
to the growing tip,” notes 
Bremer. “ If the tip is healthy, 
the crop will yield more than if 
replanted or shredded for a 
second crop. If the decision is 
made to shred, cut the sorghum 
at about the 4-inch height. This 
produces tillers at ground level 
which result in stronger stalks 
and more uniform heading than 
a higher shredding.”

The agronomist adds that 
sorghum shredded in the bloom 
stage will require another 30 to 
60 days before reaching bloom 
again.

“ Even with heavy hail dam­
age. all is not lost as far as 
sorghum is concerned,” em­
phasizes Bremer. “ Sorghum 
has the ability to compensate for 
stand losses so that a 50 percent 
stand reduction does not equal a 
50 percent yield loss. With an 
even distribution, the remaining 
plants will make more grain per 
head. This means that usually 
more than 50 percent of the 
stand must be lost before re­
planting becomes economical.”

When assessing hail-dam­
aged corn and sorghum, pro­
ducers need to take a close look 
at leaf damage once the decision 
is made to leave the crop, adds 
the agronomist. Leaf loss will 
determine expected reductions 
in grain yield. Of course, the big

factor here is the crop's stage of 
growth. Small plants can lose all 
their leaves without affecting 
grain yields. But the further 
along the crop is when damage 
occurs, the more severely grain 
yields will suffer.

“ If grass is a problem in 
corn and sorghum that has 
suffered hail damage, then pro­
ducers face another decision,” 
emphasizes Bremer. “ Since 
grasses cannot be controlled 
with postemergenee -herbicides, 
replanting may be advisable 
even though the crop would 
probably recover. If an alterna­
tive crop is chosen, producers 
must consider any carryover 
from previously applied herbi­
cides.”

When replanting, the agro­
nomist advises producers to 
choose early or medium matur­
ity hybrids in an attempt to 
avoid insect and disease pro­
blems along with poor soil 
moisture and high soil tempera­
ture late in the growing season. 
These factors all limit late corn 
and sorghum yields.

Inflation will become a much 
used word in coming months. 
We will very likely hit a 9 plus 
percent figure by the end of 
1978.

This hits the average home 
buyer with a tough decision; 
either spend a larger part of 
income on a house than buyers 
did in earlier years, or accept 
less space and niceties than 
people have become used to 
having. Not only has the price of 
new housing gone up, the 
quality has gone down and 
maintenance costs have also 
risen.

So far, home buyers have 
chosen to pay more, but experts 
see trouble ahead because Infla­
tion has pushed consumen-al- 
most to the limit of their ability 
to pay the costs of home 
ownership.

The consumer price index 
for all items rose 92 percent 
between 1965 and 1977. Median 
family income rose 134 percent. 
But the average sales price of a 
new house rose 144 percent and 
average monthly housing ex­
penses shot up 199 percent. The 
price of an existing house rose 
130 percent between 1968 and 
the end of 1977. Annual housing 
expense as a share of family 
income rose from 28 percent in 
1965 to 36 percent in 1977.

The thing that keeps housing 
demand strong is the number of

new family formation, especially 
for single family residences. It 
will stay strong for the next four 
or five years. But it will become 
tougher for the average consum­
er to pay for and maintain a 
house. There is already a trend 
away from extras such as family 
rooms, multiple bathrooms and 
air conditioning and a move 
toward more condominiums,

cluster houses and apartments.
Some costs of housing may 

level off. Political pressure is 
putting a ceiling on real estate 
taxes. But it will be several 
years before the effect of tax 
restrictions will be realized.

Consumers can expect hous­
ing costs to continue to move 
up.

Late Planting ?
If you are late planting corn, plant Trojan 
Brand TXS-102. This corn produced better • 
than 9,600 dry, last year locally. Have 
Trojan Brand milo seed, which is green bug 
tolerance. M56G and M60G for dry land and 
irrigated.

Am now dealer for Paymaster seeds. Have 
on hand Sweet Sioux, hybrid sudan seed.

Also have BULK garden seed, along with 
Ferry-Morse packet garden and Flower seed.

For Yonr Snnd Nnnds Us 
If Wo Don’t Havo It Will Got It

BROWN SEED
2015 W kmn Blvd

Ph. 272-3335

Tri-County Savings & Loan 

Association

Announces The Issuance 
Of

Two New Money Market Certificates 
Effective June 1, 1978

A six-month money market savings certificate issued in minimum 
denominations of SIO.OOO with a six-month maturity. Tri-County 
Savings will offer an annual rate of 1/4 of 1 percent above the 
average yield on new issues of six-month bills at the Treasury's 
weekly auction.
An eight-year certificate of deposit, issued in minimum denomina­
tions of $1,000, with maturities of 8-10 years, at the new 8 percent

. >,n ,. maximum rate of interest compounded daily, yiel<Un8 8.33
'ifitmou afiPWWBfium iluii -nA iBfiimrO to nuo ) uni

The purchase of these instruments involves ao sales commission, 
advisory or redemption fees and no distribution charges.

KWl aovMK
LENDII ’»ill'

M E M B E R

H1G
SAVINGSjAND LOAN ASSOCIATION

*■

O f U e m  in :  M U L E S H O E  /  F R I O N A  /  L I T T L E  F I E L D  /  F A R W C L l  “J

1 CITY OF MULESHOE
I CONDENSED STATEMENT OF CASH RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

For the Year Ended March 31, 1978
Water & Sewer Library

Total General Water & Sewer Soc. Sec. Golf Course Tax Int. & Pro-Rata Book- Capital Fed. Rev.
All Funds Fund Revenue Fund Fund Sinking Fund Fund Mobile Projects Fund Sharing

I CASH BALANCE APRIL 1, 1977 $ 59 446 20 758 24 050 -0- 1 203 1 470 1 954 8 394 1 310 307

1 RECEIPTS
I Taxes, Interest & Penalty 272 348 194 319 78 029
I U tilities , Trash & Mosquito
| Control 344 000 74 047 269 953
1 Franchise Tax 39 129 39 129
I Fines 18 418 18 418
I City Sales Tax 125 345 125 345
| Federal Revenue Sharing 65 676 O J  d / o

1 Transfers 31 175 31 175
1 Other (Including Bond Issue) 271 477 35 028 24 783 1 135 65 609 5 023 328 36 184 103 387

I TOTAL RECEIPTS 1 167 568 486 286 294 736 1 135 65 609 114 227 328 36 184 103 387 65 676

1 TOTAL FUNDS TO
1 ACCOUNT FOR 1 227 014 507 044 318 786 1 135 66 812 115 697 2 282 44 578 104 697 65 983

| DISBURSEMENTS
1 General Government -
£ Operations 495 795 448 305 47 490
1 Water and Sewer
I Operating Expenses 143 145 143 145
I Capital Outlay 43 465 14 700 22 616 2 149 4 000
] Bonded Indebtedness -
I Principal, Interest and
| Agents Fees 173 586 67 061 106 525
1 Increase -  Investments 132 927 28 504 2 125 1 135 1 626 1 994 83 020 14 523.
I Other - Transfers, Etc. 141 090 5 562 31 175 65 989 288 19 705 18 371

I TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 1 130 008 497 071 266 122 1 135 65 989 108 151 2 282 19 705 103 540 66 013

[ CASH BALANCE MARCH 31, 1978 $ 97 006 9 973 52 664 -0 -_ 7 546 -0- 24 813 1 157 (30)

«
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TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION

AUSTIN — Texas in­
comes are zipping along 
ahead of Ihe rest of the na­
tion in all major categories 
of business this year.

A Commerce Department 
report for the first quarter 
said the overrall increase in 
Texas is 4.9 per cent, com­
pared with a 3.6 percent na­
tional average.

And the national increase, 
according to the Bureau of 
Economic Analysis, was the 
biggest quarterly gain since 
the present economic expan­
sion began. •

During the period, con­
sumer prices increased about 
one percent. Incomes sur­
passed price hikes in all 
states except West Virginia 
which had a major coal 
strike.

Biggest Texas gain was in 
the area of farm income, 
which went up 41.1 percent 
during the first quarter. The 
national average farm in­
come jump was 28 percent.

A nationwide $700 mil­
lion federal payment to 
wheat farmers during De­
cember and higher cash 
receipts from crops account­
ed for the farm income in­
crease.

Mining (including oil and 
gas) income bounced up­
ward 6.8 percent in Texas, 
though the national figure 
was less than one percent.

Manufacturing personal 
income rose 5.2 percent in 
Texas, compared with three 
percent nationally.

Ten other states—North 
Dakota. Montana. South 
Dakota. Nebraska. Idaho, 
Iowa. Kansas. Michigan. 
Kentucky and Mississippi 
had bigger increases.

Tough Contest Due
Republicans promised to 

field their most-formidable 
statewide group of candi­
dates this fall.

U.S. Sen. John Tower has 
multi-million-dollar war- 
chest for his re-election 
drive against U.S. Rep. Boh 
Krueger, who won the 
Democratic senatorial nomi­
nation over Joe Christie. In 
spite of their bruising pri­
mary campaign, Christie 
pledged his help to Krueger.

Attorney General John 
Hill won the Democratic

gubernatorial nomination 
from Gov. Dolph Briscoe 
and three others without a 
runoff, hut he is promised 
a run for his money by 
Republican William P. Cle­
ments of Dallas. Clements 
spent $1.6 million in the lit­
tle k( 130,000-votc) Repub­
lican primary, and said he 
probably will spend about a 
million more in the general 
election.

Mark White was the up­
set winner over Price Daniel 
Jr. for the Democratic attor­
ney general’s nomination, 
and will he challenged by 
James Baker III of Hous­
ton. Baker indicated he is 
prepared to raise $1 million 
for the campaign.

Ratios Decline
Though estimated market 

value of Texas property was 
$232.6 billion, it was valued 
at $36.4 billion in 1975 by 
tax assessors, according to 
Texas Research League.

Average assessed value 
was 15 6 percent of market 
value on local tax rolls.

The ratio of assessed val­
ue to market value varied 
from 2.6 percent in Real 
County to 35.6 percent in 
Reeves County. TRL said.

The league said assess­
ment ratios dropped from 
19.6 percent in 1966 and 
17.1 percent in 1971.

Counties levied $388 mil­
lion in taxes during 1975- 
76. Other values were set by 
districts (hospitals, junior 
colleges and road and wa­
ter service) for tax purposes. 
About 164 school districts 
use county assessments.

Courts Speak
The Court of Criminal 

Appeals upheld a four-year 
prison term assessed ousted 
Duval County District Judge 
O. P. Carrillo on conviction 
of theft.

The Supreme Court said 
counties can be sued for 
deaths and injuries due to 
flooded crossings if they 
don’t provide adequate warn-

LttSbUUfOO 1)103

Court of Criminal Ap­
peals dismissed a mlirder 
conviction against a Central 
Texas man on grounds the 
trial should have been moved 
from Hill County.

A conviction of a father 
for castrating his son by

Why Pay More
See Randy Or One 

Of His Salesmen Today!

Johnson
Chevrolet

2 0 1 Commerc* 227-2050

radiation was affirmed by 
the Court of Criminal Ap­
peals.

The Supreme Court held 
county mutual insurance 
companies arc not covered 
hy the deceptive trade prac­
tices laws.

Improper jury instruc­
tion resulted in reversal of 
the murder conviction of 
Delmond Randle in Ama­
rillo.

A Bryan court verdict 
that nothing could be re­
covered from the estate of 
a dead Texas A&M Uni­
versity health center phy­
sician on a malpractice suit 
was unhcld hv Ihe Supreme 
Court.

AG Opinions
Use of secret ballots by 

governmental bodies to elect 
officers is prohibited hy the 
Texas Open Meetings Act, 
Attorney General John Hill 
said in a recent opinion.

In other new opinions. 
Hill concluded:

Use of public property, 
labor or services by a public 
official or employee for pri­
vate benefit constitutes the 
offense of theft.

The Harris County com­
missioners court can legally 
authorize payments of $10 
per meeting per court mem­
ber (or county employee 
representing a court mem­
ber) as a part of his salary 
for attending the meetings.

Short Snorts
President Carter will ap­

pear in Houston June 23 at 
a five-state regional fund­
raising dinner sponsored by 
the Democratic National 
Committee. Texas. Arkan­
sas. Louisiana. New Mexico 
and Oklahoma Democrats 
will participate.

D. K. Davis of Dallas is 
new operational vice presi­
dent of the Texas Independ­
ent Producers and Royalty 
Owners Association.

Texas Democrats paraded 
their statewide candidates 
in a harmony fest at a meet­
ing to canvass the May 6 
primary returns.

Gov. Briscoe announced 
a 30-day stay of execution 
for William David Hovila. 
though the man. condemned 
for murdering a Dallas 
lawyer, dropped his appeals.

The governor has more 
than 200 appointments to 
offices and hoards (many of 
them minor) he can make 

“during the final seven and a 
half months'of his adminis­
tration.

Texas Public Utility Com­
mission moved to ban so- 
called junk telephone call 
advertisements which can’t 
be interrupted hy hanging 
up.

BIBLE VERSE
"The grass withereth. 

the flower fadeth; but the 
word o f God shall stand 
forever.

1. Who was the author of 
the above statement?
2.What was his position 

at the time?
3. To whom was he talk­
ing?

Aisvtrs To BiMt Vint

1.Isaiah.
2. He was Israel’s most 
outstanding prophet.
3. To the children of 
Israel.

Kelly Green , Inc.
H a v e

Soybean Seed Available

★  Certified Colenbes

★  Certified Clark 63’s 

a Mitchell

★  Essex

Forages For Lay By Land

Call

Kelly Green Seeds, Inc.
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LOUISA’S 
LETTER

Dear Louisa,
Do you think that senior* in 

high school should stay out to 
parties until one or two o’clock 
in the morning? 1 have a 
daughter in that class and she 
says that all the other girls do 
every Friday and Saturday 
night.

It worries me very much 
but I hate for her to be the only 
one who can’t go with the 
crowd.

What do you think about 
this?

Mrs. H.--N.C.

Answer:
I certainly do not think that 

high school girls should keep 
such hours. And if I were you I 
should get in touch with some 
of the other mothers and find 
out if they are not being high 
pressured with the same 
argument.

For some special occasion, 
such as a Junior- Senior 
banquet and dance, the bars 
may be let down a bit, but 
eleven-thirty or twelve o’clock 
is certainly late enough for 
school girls to stay out on 
weekend parties.

If you mothers would get 
togetner and talk it over with 
the girls and boys, you will 
probably find them co-opera­
tive, particularly so if they find 
that all of them must abide by 
the same rules.

Louisa

Dear Louisa,
I am going with a boy who 

drinks a great deal. This is his 
only bad habit and he says he 
will give it up if I marry him.

I love him a lot but I don’t 
want to be married to a 
drunkard.

Do you think he will really 
stop if I marry him?

Grace, Okla.

Answer:
No, I certainly do not. If he 

doesn’t think enough of you to 
reform before marriage, he 
will never do so afterward.

If I were you and really 
loved him very much, I should 
tell him that I would marry him 
one year from the time he 
stopped his drinking.

Louisa
Addreaa letters: Louisa, Boa
S32, Orangeburg, S.C. 29115

MORE WINNERS--From the fourth grade, five students were presented T-shirts at Mary FeShazo 
Elementary School following the recent Read-a-Thon. From left, standing, Jaime Torres, Debbie Hicks 
and Jarrod Embry and front, Carolyn Hodges and Stacy Smith.

Carter proposes more 
money for solar energy.

“ Full employment’’ bill 
clears Senate committee.

Huge run away iceberg 
floating towards Africa. £

S i n g l e t o n - E l l i s  F u n e r a l  H o m e

24 Hour Ambulance  Service 

Ph. 272-4574 Muleshoe

« * *

l ^ y i LESHOE STATE b a n k

S W IN G S  DOLLARS
HIGHER

Money Maricet Certificates
Malaskaa Stats Baak i t  aaw Is s io l i f  aaw s ix -n oath  

Moaay M a rk tt  C artifica tas  tk a t w ill aara tba s a a t  b l|b  
In te r e il  rata a t six-aioatb U.S. T raatary  k ills .
Moaay M arkat C artifica tas  w ill bo (stood la $ 1 0 ,0 0 0  
■iaiw aais w ith a s ix -w o ith  a ia ta r lty . la ta ra s t w ill ba based 
oa tba o v e ra te  s ix -n o atb  U.S. Trtasary  b ill ratas  payable  
at tba data of issaaaca aad is la a ra a ta a d  fa r Ufa of tba 
c a rtlflca ta .

•Law requires a penalty for early withdrawal.

For More Information> Call 272-4561 Or Come By Our 
Savingg Department Today, 101 W. Am er. Bird.

ihe 
ready hank

M U L E S H O E

lopood oo i s ,  l i f t  of fo lks  do

Member FDIC

411-3110 F irw o ll, Taxes

i >
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SUNDAY 9-8 

MON. - SAT. 8-9

"Each of these advertised items is required to be 
readily available for sale at or below the advertised 
price in each store, except as specifically noted in 
this ad."
Prices food June 5-10, 1978. We reserve the 
right to limit quantities. None sold to dealers.

Combination 
6 Centers, 4  Ends

501 Am erican Blvd., 
M uleshoe

FREE!
One 69* Pkg. Morton Barbecue-Sour 

Cream & Onion

POTATO CHIPS
When you buy one (1) 8-oz. Pkg. Morton's 

Potato Chips for 89*.
One (1) 3-oz. Pkg. Land 0 Frost

WAFER THIN 
MEATS

When you buy one (1) 3-oz. Pkg. 
Land 0 Frost Wafer Thin Meats at 

the regular price.

BUY ONE, GET ONE 
FREE!

VELVEETA 
CHEESE!

L im it o n *  (1) w ith  17 50 o r 
m o r*  a d d it io n a l  p u rc h a a *  
in c lu d in g  baar, w in *  4  c iga r- 

• n * a

Nabisco

in « J  Soda Border % T o isun  a m .

tiasta ”£  1 8 e Orange Drink 8 5 e Grapefruit Juice * Z

DOUBLE S&H
COOKES

19-oz.
Pkg.

^■G REENI
89c STAMPS 
I ALL WEEK!!

WE WELCOME FOOD STAMP CUSTOMERS
TURN PAGE FOR DAIRY DAYS SPECIALS

< i
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I M k .
airy Days at

We Redeem

llllllllWE GLADLY
B q i c n i  i m i

Price* good thru Jen* 10, 1978. We reserve the right to limit quantities. 
None told to dealer*.

"Each of these advertised items is required to be 
readily available for sale at or below the advertised 
pride in each store, except as specifically noted in this
ad.”

Farmer Jones

TASTY
FRANKS

Market Style

SLICED

W EOVES&H 
GREN SIMM’S

Lb.

$ 1 0 9

A iTf.f.plK
r

i

ruiiii
ROAST
$10 91

FREEZER SALE
W estern Heavy G ra in Fed Beef, W hole

Bottom
Round
W aatem  H eavy G ra in  Fod Beef, W hole

Sirloin
T ip ......................
W hole o r  R ib  H a ll

* 1 1 5 9

* 1
| 7 9

* 1 l 4 5
NO CHARGE FOR CUTTING & WRAPPING

Sugar Lem on Tea M ix

Nestea ....................................
T om ato  mm

Campbell’ s Soup 0 °^f.
Dog Food

Gravy T ra in .......................
A rm o u r

Vienna Sausage........  .... ^ a n
T o d d le r D ispo sab le  D iapers

Pam pers................................ ,2bU
A sso rted  V a rie tie s , P igg ly  W ig g ly

Drink M i x ............................ " &
P ig g ly  W igg ly

M u s ta rd ................................* s
N ab isco  C ookies

Oreo Cookies .......
N ab isco  C oo k ies

Oreo Double Stuff.........’p"9

*  1 58 Rite C rackers.................. ,’VS 8 9 c
M 00 TorUiiaCh7 ps°“ ............... %  69 *
,  ~  P lan te r s Cheez B a lls. C u r ls  o r  Mmm

* 9 "  Corn Chips....................... " X  6 9 c
3 9 c Pancake M i x .....................%t 8 9 c

* r »  Syrap.......................................“ s  M 29
99 *  Veg-AH “s , 36 '
3 6 *  S n e  C r a c k e r s S .  4 9 *
89 *  Tea" B ags...........................
8 9 ‘ ^ s t y r o c u p s ........................... ,r»s 65 *

PARI 
OLEO

49*

U/2%
Piggly Wiggly

LOWFAT

Kraft

VBVEETA 
CHOSE

$ 1 8 9
Limit one (1) 2-Lb. Pkg. with $7.50 or 
nore additional purchase

2-Lb.
Pkg.

Goldenauiuen ^

FLOMMCORN 8  ... *1

r  FROZEN FOODS
G reen G ia n t N ibb le rs . Frozen

Corn On The Cob
G reen G ian t F rozen C ream  S ty le  C om .

6 9 *
C orn in  B u tte r S auce o r Sw eet P e a t In 
B u tte r S auce

Frozen Vegetables m  5 9 *
P ig g ly  W ig g ly  Frozen

^Whipped Topping . *  4 7 }
P ig g ly  W ig g ly  Texes Style

Biscuits 3 s  8 9 *
r  NON-FOODS

M outhw ash

Listermint „ » 1 5 ‘
. .  BH. ■

A ll V a rie ties  C o lga te

Instant Shave ,”s  7 9 *
R evlon. AH Vartebee

Flex Shampoo ►«4159
. .  BH. ■

H a ir S p ray, A ll VarleHea

^tqua Net "& 6 9 }

O V  S A L E  T i l l s  W E E K

AUTUMN COLLECTION 
STONEWARE

CEREAL
BOWL

Only 7 9
p o o  purchase
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Junior
The Muleshoe Junior High 

School Awards Assembly was 
held on Friday, May 26, in the 
Muleshoe High School Auditor­
ium. Mistress of Ceremonies 
was Mrs. Frances Kirkland, a«i 
the pledge and prayer were 
presented by the Student Coun­
cil. Jan Whitt, student council 
president, issued the welcome.

The Annual,dedicated to Ar­
thur Askew, was presented to 
Mrs. Arthur Askew, in remem­
brance of her husband, by Mike 
Richardson.

The ESA Outstanding Youth 
Award was presented to Patty 
Garcia. Mrs. John Blackwell 
presented this award.

Soil Conservation Awards 
were presented by the Black- 
water Valley Soil and Water 
Conservation District to Belinda 
Wheeler, Marsha Williams, 
Tamara Gilliland, Lincoln Snell 
and Kristi Ethridge.

Other Awards included Eng­
lish 6, Kelly Hamblen; Spelling
6, Angela Ellis; Girls PE 7, 
Sandra Martinez; Girls Athletics
7, Kelly Bayless; presented by 
Miss Brenda Scott; Social Stu­
dies 7, Michael Isaac; presented 
by Mrs. Dorothy Beddingfield; 
English 7, Rhonda Dunham; 
Spelling 7, Sharia Hawkins; 
Reading 6, Sherri Kinard; pre­
sented by Mrs. Pat Watson; 
English 8, Shelley Davis; Spell­
ing 8, Lupe Rosales; presented 
by Mrs. Aileen Siewert; Read­
ing 7, Cecil Chavez, presented 
by Mrs. Linda Marr; Reading 8, 
Dana Brewer, presented by 
Mrs. Barbara Milbum; Reading 
Lab, Ronnie Luna, presented by 
Mrs. Kathy Kramer; Science 6, 
Brenda Flowers, presented by 
Mrs. Pat Gunter; Science 7, 
Tamara Gilliland; Science 8, Jan 
Whitt; Outstanding Science, 
Tamara Gilliland; presented by 
Mrs. Mary Scoggin.

Also, Band 6, Kelly Ham­
blen; Band 7, Todd Holt; Band
8, Regina Bevers; presented by
Miss Martha Anthis; Band Hon­
orable Mention, Debra Bouch- 
elle; Art 6, Deidre McGee, 
presertted by Mrs. Jean Moore; 
Art 7, Sandra Haight; Art 8, 
Manuel Garcia; presented by 
Mrs. Sandra Hopper; Girls PE 
8, Tammy Grigsby; Girls PE 6, 
Erna Olivarez; Girls Athletics 8, 
Cindy Turner; Health 8, Shelley 
Davis; presented by Mrs.
Sharyn Rowers; Boys PE 6, 
Mike Pecina; Boys PE 7, Ramon 
Shane Sanchez; Boys PE 8 
Jimmy Green; Boys Athletics 8, 
Ronnie Angeley; presented by 
Ronnie Jones. Basketball, La- 
von Rhodes; Track, Paula Wil­
liams, presented by Mrs. 
Sharyn Flowers; Football,
Monty Hysinger; Track, George 
Vela; presented bv Ronnie 
Jones; Boys Athletics 7, Sammy, 
Gonzales, presented by Ruben 
DeLeon; Speech 7, Michael 
Issac; Speech 8, Kristi Henry; 
presented by Gary Goodin.

Included in the Awards were 
Social Studies 6, Rayshel Mas- 
singill; presented by Mrs. Ruth 
Page; Social Studies 8, Curtis 
Wheeler; presented by F.D.

High
Rogers; Math 6. Randall Stev­
ens; presented by Mrs. Evelyn 
Northcutt; Math 7, Becky Lo- 
baugh; presented by Randy 
Crook; Math Lab, June Perez; 
presented by  Mrs. Margaret 
Teaff; Math 8, Cindy Turner; 
Journalism, Lupe Rosales; Stud­
ent Council, all members; His­
torical Society, Stacy Shroeder, 
presented by Mike Richardson.

Perfect Attendance for this 
year included: Sixth Grade, 
Thurman Coleman; Seventh 
Grade. Lori Anne Del Toro; 
Elvira Nunez, Robert Lopez, 
Dana Smith; Eighth Grade, 
Jamey Chancey, Israel Del 
Toro, Kristi Henry, Sylvia Hod­
ges, Joyce Kutzli and Janie 
Martinez.

Those on the honor roll were 
called. They included: Sixth 
Grade Honor Roll, John David 
Agee, Terry Baker, Sherri Bes- 
sire, Dan Bouchelte, Ronald 
Briggs. Deena Burris, Maria 
Bynum, Angela Ellis, Brenda 
Flowers, Beatrice Irma Garcia, 
Kelly Hamblen,Kacy Henry, 
Traci Hutton, Polly Susanna 
Hyde, Trent Hysinger, Keisha 
Johnson, Sherri Kinard, Can­
dace Long. David Marth, Julie 
Rayshel Massingill, Sharia Mor­
rison. Darin Shaw, Dana 
Splawn, Randall Stevens, Melis­
sa Wagnon, James Chad Wil­
liams and Mary Ann Ybarra.

Seventh Grade Honor Roll: 
Linda Bell, Debra Briscoe, Jean­
ette Burks, Scott Campbell, 
Cecil Chavez, Marleea Cox, Lori 
Anne Del Toro, Rhonda Dun­
ham. Stacy Elder, Patty Garcia, 
Tamara Gilliland, Sandra 
Haight, Sharia Hawkins, Todd

Young Pigs 
Survival To 
Be Highlight
LUBBOCK-- Young pig survi­
val, management of young pigs 
and a report on the swine 
market outlook will highlight' 
Texas Tech University’s 26th 
annual Swine Short Course on 
June 29.

The short course is co-spon­
sored by Tech, the Texas Pork 
Producers Association and the 
Texas Pork Producers Board.

Scheduled speakers at the 
short course will include Dr. 
Paul Gorham, DVM, research 
scientist at Elanco Products Co., 
Indianapolis; Glenn Grimes, ex­
tension livestock marketing spe­
cialist, the University of Mis­
souri; Dr. B.G. Harmon, direct­
or of swine research, Ralston 
Purina Company, St. Louis; 
Kenneth Horton, executive vice 
president, Texas Pork Produc­
ers Association, Austin; and 
John H. Westerhoff, president, 
Farmland Food, Inc., Kansas 
City.

Dr. A. Max Lennor, assist­
ant dean of the College of 
Agricultural Sciences at Texas 
Tech, will present the opening 
remarks. Drs. Leland F. Tribble 
and Donald E. Orr, Jr. of the 
animal science faculty will pre­
side and present progress re­
ports on the university's swine 
research. Other Texas Tech 
researchers also will participate.

The short course, open to the 
public, requires a $10 registra­
tion fee. The course will be held 
at the Farmer's Co-Op Com­
press. 3800 Southeast Drive, 
Lubbock.

Registration will begin at 
8:30 a.m. and activities will end 
at 3 p.m. A luncheon is heing 
sponsored by Elanco. For fur­
ther information contact either 
Tribble or Ort at (806) 742-2825.

Clovis Hog Co. 
Market

As Of May 31
Barrows l Gilts

210-240 LB.

ll t *47”
Sows 364 l  374 !
Boras 284 l  304
Announcing New Market 

Plans For Your Hogs. We Will 
Be Receiving All Market Hogs, 
Sows & Bores On Tuesday & 

Wedneseday Of Each Week. This 
Plan Will Bring A Better Price 
For Your Hogs In This Area.

Thanks
Henry Hathorn

Clovit Hog  Co.

School Holds Award Assembly
Holt, Michael Issac, Shawnda 
Knowlton, Becky Lobaugh. 
Stacy Schroeder, Dana Smith, 

Lincoln Snell, Sandra Speck, 
Lori Stroud, Joni Sudduth and 
Martina Valdez.

Eighth Grade Honor Roll: 
Ronnie Angeley, Cara Bass, 
Eddie Black, Debra Bouchelle,

Dana Brewer, Michelle Bryant 
Robin Burgess, Stacey Camp 
bell, Shelley Davis, Mary Espin 
oza, Jacinda Gleason, Alan Har- 
rison, Kristi Henry, Sherri 
Henry, Monty Hysinger, Rhon­
da Mills, Susie Pierce, Wayne 
Precure, Dusty Puckett, Tim 
Sain, Cindy Turner, Jill Turner,

Belinda Wheeler, Curtis Wheel­
er and Jan Whitt.

Chosen as Mr. MJHS for 
1977-78 was Ronnie Angeley 
and Mrs. MJHS was Robin 
Burgess.

Outstanding boy was Monty 
Hysinger and Outstanding Girl 
was Jan Whitt.

Tomato Tips May Produce T op’ Crops
Young tomato and pepper 

plants often undergo consider­
able trauma after being trans­
planted into the garden. Imag­
ine the shock to a tender tomato 
plant that began life in a warm, 
humed greenhouse, when it is 
suddenly uprooted from a plea­
sant environment, planted in 
cold soil, buffeted by strong, 
dry, West wind all afternoon 
and” treated” to 12 hours of 
temperatures ranging from 35 to 
40 degrees.

It is no wonder that its stem 
turns purple, its leaves droop 
and it gets that ragged look.

Next to spring frost, wind is 
the worst enemy of young 
vegetables, especially tomatoes 
and peppers. Contrary to popu­
lar belief, the tomato plant can 
not be hardened to cold or to 
wind desiccation. So, it makes 
sense to give it all the protection 
that you can until the weather

calms down.
There are many ways to 

protect plants from the wind and 
cold. Hotcaps are reinforced 
waxed paper domes which are 
set over young plants or newly 
seeded crops like squash and 
melons and anchored down with 
soil around the edges. You 
must cut a little hole in the side 
of the hotcap away from the 
prevailing wind to keep the 
temperature from rising too 
high inside the hotcap.

A cage can be constructed 
from concrete reinforcine wire 
and wrapped in plastic film, 
then placed over the tomato 
plant to shelter it from wind, 
cold and hail while letting in 
most of the sunlight.

Placing tin cans (with the top 
and bottom cut out) over the 
plants is not recommended be­
cause the sides of the can shade 
the plant, and that is not good.

Just breaking the force of 
the wind will be very helpful to 
the survival and early growth of 
newly set vegetable plants or 
seedlings that have just recently 
emerged. Shakes (the kind used 
on roofs) or shingles stuck 
upright in the soil about six 
inches to the southwest of a 
newly set plant will shelter it 
from the hot, dry afternoon 
wind. Rows of temporary wind­
breaks can be set up in small 
gardens using shakes, snow 
fence or scrap lumber.

The idea is to stop only about 
half of the wind volume and let 
half pass through the wind­
break. Each successive rand of 
windbreak material will further 
slow down the wind speed. 
Information furnished by:
Dr. Roland Roberts 
Area Vegetable Specialist 
Route 3, Box 213AA 
Lubbock, Texas 79401 
806-746-6101

Ending the program was the 
presentation of the eighth grade 
promotion certificates. These 
went to: Eric Allison, Eneida 
Almanza, Jackie Alvarado, Ron 
nie Angeley, Delbert Atwood 
Stacey Barnhill, Cara Bass 
Regina Bevers, Judy Bigger 
staff, Eddie Black, Starla Black 
Debra Bouchelle. Tami Bratch 
er, Dana Brewer, Michelle Brv 
ant, Edna Buckner, Robin Bur 
gess, Stacey Campbell, Alejan 
dro Cardenas, Freddie Carrara 
Jesse Carrion, Fernando Casa 
nova, Margie Castillo, Linda 
Castorena, Jamey Chancey, 
Nettie Ruth Coleman, Israel Del
Toro, Kevin Dudley, Sherri El- 
lard, Mary Espinoza, Joe Don 
Fabela, Ruben Fabela, Dolores 
Flores, Gracie Garcia, Manuel 
Garcia, Roman Garcia, Kim 
Gatewood, Mary Jane Gauna, 
Jacinda Gleason, Carmen Go­
mez, Diane Gonzales, Robert 
Gonzales, Ella Graves.

April Green, Jimmy Green, 
Tammy Grigsby, Denna Harris, 
Alan Harrison. Lori Hartline, 
Donna Hawkins, Kristi Henry, 
Sherri Henry, Julio Hernandez, 
Doyla Hight, Sylvia Hodges, 
Kevin Howard, Kevin Hucka- 
bee, Mike Huerta, Charlene 
Hurtado, Monty Hysinger, Jose 
Ibarra, Jimmy Jaramillo, Trent 
Kirven, Joyce Kutzli, Delilah 
Lopez, JoAnn Lopez, Rosemary

Lopez, Trini Lopez, Ronnie 
Luna, Terry McCamish, Lisa 
McDonald, Beth Manzanares, 
Peggy Martin, Terri Martin, 
Frank Martinez, Graviel Martin­
ez, Janie Martinez.

Joe Albert Martinez, Joe 
Angel Martinez, Jeff Meeks, 
Estella Mendoza, Jaime Men­
doza, Yolanda Mendoza, Rhon­
da Mills, Lynn Moors, Lee 
Murphy, Joe Neel, Larry Nor­
man, Cuca Nunez, John Orozco, 
Mary Alice Orozco, Rudy Oroz­
co, Steve Orozco, Kellie Over­
man, Pedro Pacheco, Sondra 
Parker. Denese Peterson, Susie

Pierce, Eugene Porras, Brian 
Powell, Kay Lynn Prather, 
Wayne Precure, Dusty Puckett, 
Sylvia Quintana, Rosalinda 
Quintanilla, Irma Ramons, Bea­
trice Reyna, Beatrice Reynero, 
Lavon Rhodes, Raquel Rodri­
quez, Susan Rodriquez, Lupe 
Rosales, Tim Sain, Frances 
Saldana, Mina Sanchez.

Maria Sanchez, Ralph San­
chez, Scott Saylor, Tommy Sex­
ton, Janet Shain, Delia Shaw, 
Jennifer Tillema, Raul Torres, 
Michelle Townsel, Cindy Turn­
er, Jill Turner, Staci Vandiver, 
Ricky Vaughn, George Vela, 
Belinda Wheeler, Curtis Wheel­
er, Jan Whitt, Marsha Wil­
liams. Paula Williams, Terry 
Williams, Johnny Ybarra and 
Jenny Ziegenfuss.

Save With Our 
Low Overhead

Come In Soon

Johnson
Chevrolet

20? Comm* re* Sudan 227-2050

V

ATTEND THE CHURCH
OF YOUR CHOICE * -s rw

LONGVIEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE Pastor B.C. Stonecipher
Ninth & Ave. C 
Pal Ridley, Pastor

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
130 W. Avenue G 
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School 10:00 a.nt. 
Worship 11:00 
LATIN AMERICAN 
METHODIST MISSION 
Ave. D and Fifth Street 
R.Q. Chavez, Pas(or

THE COMMUNITY CHURCH 
H.D. Hunter. Pastor 
Morton Hwv.
CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
James Williams, Pastor 
1733 W. Ave. C.
PROGRESS SEC OND 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Clifford Slay. Pastor 
1st and 3rd Sundays 
FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH
Rev. David Hamblin
507 West Second, Muleshoe
PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH
621 South First
Elder Bernard Gowcns
MULESHOE ASSEMBLY OF
GOD
517 S. First 
Rev. Joe Stone
E MMANUEL BAPTI ST 
CHURCH
Iglesia Bautista Emmanuel 
107 E. Third 
lsaias Catdenas, Pastor 
RICHLAND HILTS' BAPTIST 
CHURCH
17th and West Ave. D 
Roy L. Sikes. Pastor 
SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION 
Rev. Ynes Aleman 
East Third and Ave. E.
TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH 
314 Ave. B 

Rev. Gene Prevo
MULESHOE CHURCH OF 
CHRIST
Roycc Clay. Minister 
Clovis Hwv.

We all thr i l l  to a ...

F A M I L I A R  T U N E
It is so soothing, comforting, and pleasing to listen to our favorite 

tunes when played by capable artists. These tunes can make our minds 

wander back to pleasant memories of days gone by, and also awake 

us to new joys. Each Sunday we have the opportunity to be thrilled 

by the preaching of God’s word, and the story of God's great love fori. • I I Ml I
us. Attend church Sunday and enjoy worshiping God with others.

The Church n God i  appointed ogemy in this world for spreading the knowledge of His love 
for man ond of His demand for mon to respond to that love by loving his neighbor Without 
this grounding in the love of God, no government or society or way of life w ill long 
persevere ond the freedoms which we hold so deor w ill inevitably perish Therefore, even 
from o selfish point of view, one should support the Church for the sake of the welfare 
of himself ond his family, leyond that, however, every person should uphold ond par 
ticipate in the Church because it tells the truth obout man s life, deoth ond destiny, the 
truth which alone will set him free to live os o child of God.

Colem on Adv. Se t*

PHJM6-3413 . <
SIXTEENTH & AVENUE D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
Terry Bouchelle, Minister

PROGRESS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Progress. Texas 
Rev. Gearld Aalbers, Pastor
NORTHSIDfc 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
117 E. Birch Street

SPANISH
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 

TEast 6th and Ave. F 
Rev. Hipolito Pecina

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE 
CHURCH 
207 E. Ave. G 
George Green, Pastor

MULESHOE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
8th Street and Ave. G 
Bob Dodd, Pastor

ST. M /\iirthW  
BAPTIST CHURCH 
West Third 
E. McFrazier, Pastor

V r. JOHN LUTHERAN 
Lariat. Texas
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor 
Sunday School Classes 
9:30 a.m.
Worship Services 
10:30 a.m.
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
220 West Ave. E 
Rev. J.E. Meeks

JEHOVAH'S WITNESS 
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Minister

IMMACULATE 
CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Father timothy Schwertner 
Northeast of City in Morrison 
Edition

WESTERN DRUG
114 Main

JOHNNIE’S 
SAFETY CENTER

320 E. Amer. Blvd. 272-3043

ALBERTSON’S SHOP 
FOR MEN’ S

228 Main 272-3000

M G ibsons  U

BEAVERS FL0WERLAND
'Flowers For All Occacions1 

272-3024 272-3116

Co
218

b l’i
Main

WHITES CASHWAY 
GROCERY

402 Main
'Where Friends Meet And Prices Talk'

BAILEY COUNTY 
MEMORIAL PARK

'Every Service A Sacred Trust' 
272-4383

BRATCHER MOTOR 
SUPPLY

107 E. Ave. B 272-4288

WATSON ALFALFA
Alfalfa, Hay

272-3552 272-4038

WHITT-WATTS-REMPE 
IMPLEMENT CO.

John Deere Dealer 
Muleshoe 272-4297

DARI-DELITE DRIVE IN
'Take Out Orders'

210 N. First 272-4482

Margie Hawkins, 

^ Manager

Compliments Of

STATE LINE 
IRRIGATION

Li ttlefie Id-Mu leshoe-Level land

MULESHOE
CO-OP
GINS

FIRST NATIONAL BANK
'Home Owned'

224 S. First

ST. CLAIRS
110 Main J g

y 401 S. First 

Mu leshoe

7 Ph. 272-4511

WESTERN SPRINKLERS, 
INC.

ZIMBUTIC

LAMBERT CLEANERS
Steam Carpet Cleaning 

Drapery Cleaning
123 Main St. 272-4726
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Deadline For Classified Ads Is At 11:00 
Tuesdays Aad Fridays

OPEN RATES
1st insertion, per word - $.11 
2nd and add., per word ■ $.09 

NATIONAL RATES 
1st insertion, per word - S.ll 
2nd and add., per word - $.07 
Minimum Charge:
1st insertion - $1.65 
2nd insertion - $1.35 
CARD OF THANKS 
30 words • $3.00 
Over 30 words charged at 
regular classified rates. 
Classified Display • $1.40 per 
column inch.
Double Rate for Blind Ads.

DEADLINE FOR INSERTION 
11:00 Tuesday for Thursday 
11:00 Friday for Sunday
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO CLASSIFY, REVISE OR 
REJECT ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR 
ANY ERROR AFTER AD HAS 
RUN ONCE.

Effective May H 1978.

1. PERSONALS
ft*************!*********** ***
GARAGE SALE: if you are 
interested in a ral BARGAIN, 
come to AMERICAN BARGAIN 
CENTER, where you can buy 
new famous brand named 
clothing for the entire family at 
about half the regular price. We 
also have bedspreads, drapes, 
drapery rods and living room 
furniture. Located one half mile 
out of Portales on the Clovis 
Highway. WE’LL HELP YOU 
BEAT INFLATION! 
l-20s-8tp

FOR YOUlCStalfiey Horne Pro 
ducts. Jewel Broyles, call 965- 
2481. 
l-16t-tfc
• • • **• • *4 *  4 4 .• • * * *• *• • • • *• * .

3. HELP WANTED

Need operators at Main Streef 
Beauty Shop. Call 272-3448. 
3-12t-tfc

For all your real estate needs 
call:

GLAZE & GOFORTH 
112 Ave. C 
272-4208

8-lls-tfc

FOR SALE: 20 acres 
pasture. 2 miles from Muleshoe, 
272-5578 or 272-3658 evenings 
and weekends.
8-22*-tfc

DUPLEX FOR SALE: 824 S 1st. 
Contact Phylis Beavers 
272-3116.
8-18t-tfc

FOR SALE; New 3 bedroom 
energy efficient brick home, 1 
car garage, 1-3/4 baths, cedar 
fence, by JAR Construction, call 
272-3758 or 272-4347.
8-22s-tfc

KREBBSREAL ESTATE 
112 Ave. C

See us for your real estate |
i  needs.

Appraisals.
L8-13s-tfc

FOR SALE: new three bedroom, 
1-3/4 bath brick home with 
fireplace and carpet, located at 
1703 W. Ave. F Call 272-4434 
or 272-3015, after 5:00 for 
appointment.
8-20t-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
2 utility rooms, fenced yard, 
fireplace. Curtli Walker, phone 
272-4876. 405 w. 6th.
8-23s-tfc

9. AUTOMOBDES FOR SALE

FOR SALE: 1955 Jeep, new 
vinyl top, matching wheels and 
tires. A-l condition. Call 272- 
4088.
9- 23s-4tc
(TM********iy*****#****#V**#!»i 
10. FARM EQUIP. FOR SALE

FOR SALE: Pump gearheads. 
70 HP Amarillo, 6-5, 90 HP 
Peerless Standard, 4-3. 80 HP 
Amarillo, 5-4. 70 HP Peerless, 
6-5. 272-4869.
10- 23s-tfc

Will sell below wholesale New 
60A Heston Stacker, G955 
MAM only 800 hours. Call noon 
or night 925-6712 
10-22s-4tc

WANTED: Typist, must be able 
to type 50 words per minute. 
Apply in person at Muleshoe 
Publishing Company, 304 W. 
2nd.

HELP WANTED: Cashier for 
Bailey County Electric Coop. 
Excellent fringe benefits. Apply 
at 305 E. Ave. B., Muleshoe, 
Tex. Closing date June 15,1978. 
An Equal Opportunity Employ­
er.
3-23s-2tc

HELP WANTED:AUsup’s Con­
venience Stores, Inc. interview­
ing for Gerks and Assistant 
Manager. Excellent advance­
ment possibilties and company 
benefits. Contact manager in 
our store in Muleshoe. An equal 
opportunity Employer.
3 22t 2tc
***••••••••>*••<***••**••**»

8. REAL ESTATE

E.E. HOLLAND REAL ESTATE

113 W. Ave. D 
PHONE 272-3293 
DAY OR NIGHT

Robin Davis, Salesman

OR SALE: New 3 bedroom. 2 
ath, 1 car garage, all carpeted 
nd built in appliances. 922 9th 
t. CaH 272-4678 or talk to 
OHN W. SMITH at TOWN 
i COUNTRY REAL ESTATE. 
-ISs-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 lake lots at Lake 
Clarendon. Call 272-5578 or 
272-3658 evenings and weeken­
ds.
8-22s-tfc

Custom Designed 
and

Made-To-Order 
RINGS-N-THINGS 

BY JEROLLY
918 E Hickory

Phone 272-3163

BIG HORN BRAND saddle and 
breast harness. Like new 946- 
3612.
11-21s-3tsc

FOR SALE: Belgium made 
hump back browning shotguns. 
All chokes and gages. Need 
money for purchasing wall pa­
per to remodel house. Paul 
Wilbanks, ph. 272-3571. 
Il-23s-2tp

M isery  ac q u a in ts  man 
with strange bedfel­
lows.

-Shakespeare.

REXAIR RAINBOW: ph 1-505- 
482-9017, 321 Girffin, Texico. 
N.M.We have new and 4 good 
late model used repairs for sale, 
guaranteed, and a lot of vacuum 
cleaners.
12-22s-3tp.

15. MISCELLANEOUS
fiiiiiisssu stissstsx tS m llS L

FOR SERVICE ON T V. Call 
272-5531.

WILSON APPLIANCE 
117 MAIN

MULESHOE, TX
We stock parts and do service 
on Zenith, Sylvania, RCA, 
Catalina. Store Hours 8-6 
Monday-Saturday.
15-16s-tfc ___________

Will do yard work, mowing or 
tilling-call 965-2123.
15-22t-3tp

EZ SEWER CLEANER same 
day service. 272-4440.
15-14t-tfc

STALKCUTTERS, 8 row, bear­
ings SI160.00
BEDKN1FER, 9 runners SS90.00 
CHISLE, 11 shank, 3-bars 
$1495.00
CHISEL. 9 shank, 3-bars 
$1175.00
CULTIVATOR, 8 row, 2-4x4’s on 
botton $1650.00
LISTER,. 9 shanks, 4x7 bar 
$1250.00
COULTERS, 28” BLADE, HE­
AVY DUTY $126.00 each 
GAGE WHEELS, HEAVY DUTY 
$105.00 each
TOOL BARS, ALL 8 ROW SIZES 
IN STOCK 
CLAMPS, all sizes 
SHANKS, HIGH CARBON C 
1080 STEEL 
EXTENSION, all sizes 
KNIFING ATTACHMENTS 
ROD WEEDER ATTACHMENTS 
DEALER INQUIRIES INVITED 
, Morton Manufacturing Co., Inc., 
Rt. 2 Box 40-A, Morton, TX 79346 
10-12t-tfc

*«*«**»♦*»*«****•***•*****•*"
11. FOR SALE OR TRADE 
**%*******%«**•*•**»•***•**

FOR SALE: Lancer mobile 
home, 15 x 72. 1977 model - 1 
year old. 2 bdr., 2 bath. 
965-2667 after 5:30 or weekends
U-19t-tfc

FOR SALE: 32' Holiday Ramb­
ler travel trailer. Loaded. Phone 
965-2868.
ll-21s-tfc

$100 REWARD Offered fo ar­
rest and conviction of anyone 
doing damage to paper stands. 
Muleshoe Publishing Co. 272- 
4536.
-llt-15-tfc

RENTAL SERVICE
Washers, dryers, televisions, 
regrigerators. By week or 
month. Call 272-5531. 

WILSON APPLIANCE 
117 MAIN 

MULESHOE, TX 
15-16-tfc

PHILLIPS HOUSE OF MUSIC 
118 MAIN

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO
Pianos, organs, band instru­
ments, new and used. Profes­
sional repairs, sheet music, 
rentals, terms.
Phone: 505-763-5041.
15-30s-tfc

SANDSTORMS
and Klrblea. They don't mix, 
but they do go together. Kirby 
rebuilts. As low as $79.95. 
LLOYD WHITE, LITTLEFIELD, 
Call 385-3357. KIRBY SALES & 
SERVICE.
15-12s-tfc

ASPHALT ROOFING, COM- 
POSTION singles, new roof and 
repairs, Free estimates. Call 
collect RON FOSHEE 385-5680. 
LITTLEFIELD ROOFING 
15-42s-tfc

REBUILT MATTRESS 
BOX SPRINGS

2-Piece Set

$ A .f> o o  m m m m
\ L o y a w a y  N o  w '

WfostorA

FOR SALE: Small fold-down 
camping trailer. Call 272-4790 
or go by 1628 W. Ave. C. 
15-23s-2tp

tri-chem
965-2622

15-l6t-tfc

FOR RENT: Trailer space and 
overnite parking. 1304 W. Ave. 
B. Call 272-3448.
15-6t-tfc

WANTED: Someone with ex­
perience in hanging fashionable 
wall paper. Must be neat and 
sober. Large house, large job. 
Paul Wilbanks, ph. 272-3571. 
15-23s-2tp

WANTED:Painting and build 
ing repair, spray acoustical ceil 
ing, tile, panelling. Call 272' 
3838 or 272-4359.

DeShazo Students Receive Awards
15-22t-8tc

12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS 
****•**».***.,,***»«**«**»**

FOR SALE:12'X9’ new kitchen 
carpet. 12'X23’ new linoleum. 
New 12’X16‘ burgundy carpet, 1 
admiral cornet 120 refrigerated 
air conditioner, ph. 272-3534 
after 5 or come by 718 W. 2nd 
after 6p.m.
12 21t 4tc
BURROWS Upholstering. Rea­
sonable rates. Also Furniture 
and Appliances bought and 
sold. Moved to 213 South 1st 
Street. Phone 272-4255.
12-12s-tfc

FOR SALE:Travel trailer, 18 ft., 
self contained, sleeps six. 512 
West Ave. B. Phone 272-3436. 
15 22t 4tp

Hay will bring a higher price 
this fall. We will stack your hay 
at a good price to you. Call 
nlghta 217-6712.
15-23s-6tc

FOR SALE: Fat cattle-S37.25. 
Must sell fast. Need money to 
purchase older model school bus 
to haul family around. Family 
got too large too fasti Max King 
272-3918.
15-23s-2tp

WANTED: r*lder model school 
bus or van. Possibility of 
making into camper. Need for 
two families, mine and my 
brother-in-law's. Max King, 
272-3918.
15-23s-2tp

Legal Notice
STATEMENT OF INTENT TO 

CHANGE RATES 
Southwestern Public Service 

Company, in accordance with 
the rules of the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas and the 
Public Utility Regulatory Act of 
Texas, hereby gives public 
notice of its intent to change its 
general retail rates in the 
counties served by it in Texas 
effective on June 16, 1978.

It is expected that the increase 
in rates for residential, 
commercial and industrial 
customers will result in an 
increase of 8.8 per cent in the 
company's gross revenue in 
Texas as compared to that 
furnished by the existing rate 
schedule.
Complete copies of the new 

rate schedules have been mailed 
or delivered to the appropriate 
officer of each affected 
municipality at least 35 days 
prior to the effective date of the 
proposed change and copies of 
the new rate schedules have 
been furnished to the Public 
Utility Commission of Texas. 
20s-4tsc

Card Of 
Thanks

During the evening hours of 
Memorial Day, May 29, the 
Muleshoe Volunteer Fire De­
partment was called to my farm 
in the Progress Community. 
They responded in force and 
very efficiently extinquished a 
pile of burning scrap lumber 
and post. Though the fire was, 
perhaps, of no great consequ­
ence, under other circumstances 
it could have been quite serious.

It gives one a comfortable 
feeling to know we have these 
dedicated and willing men stan­
ding by to serve our community 
in times of emergency. Fellows 
you are appreciated, Thanks a 
million I

Gordon Murrah
23s ltp

Out of Orbit
V *  /

'A - J

MAYBE NON YOu'lA WEAR 
YOUR MAGNETIC SHOES !
_______________  AKH

lot Sunflower Contracts
*  D a l i v r y B y  Sapf. 9

*  Top Producing Soad
*  Saod A Spraying Can Bo  

Carried By Nota Ti I Ha rv»st

Glen Watkins
915-6743

The Mary DeShazo Awards 
Assembly and Talent Show was 
held Friday, May 26, in the 
Mary DeShazo Gymnasium at 
9:30 a.m.

Alan Finney led the proces­
sional, and Tracy Tunnel pre­
sented the invocation.

The entire student body then 
stood and said the pledge of 
Allegiance to the flag. The 
welcome was given by Kristi 
Spies.
Next on the program was the 
Awards Presentation. These 
were presented by the faculty.

Yearly Honor Roll Awards: 
Grade three was presented by 
Mrs. Finley; Grade four, by 
Mrs. Grogan; and Grade five, 
by Mrs. Skipworth.

Perfect Attendance Awards 
were presented by: Third grade, 
Mrs. Schroeder; Fourth grade, 
Mrs. Rudd; and fifth grade, Mr. 
Slayden.

UIL winners and Partici­
pants were recognized by Mrs. 
Finney, third grade storytellers; 
Mrs. Costen, fourth and fifth 
grade picture memory; Mrs. 
Killingsworth, fifth grade, spell­
ing; Mrs. Smith, grade five oral 
reading; Mrs. Smith, grade five, 
Bailey County Spelling; and 
Mrs. Murphy, grade five ready 
writing.

Junior Olympic winners and 
participants were then recogniz­
ed by Mrs. Eagle.

Those participating in the 
talent show were: Third Grade, 
with a song; Tammy Nowell, 
Trina Seales and Richard Lance, 
playing an instrumental; Betsy 
Lunsford, oral reading; Rosa 
Irma Alarcon, solo; Selected 
group, lummie sticks; Janna 
Wuerflein, piano solo; group of 
fifth grade boys, the golden 
oldies pantomine.

Then presented were: the 
fourth grade with a song; Sheila 
Long, piano solo; Fifth grade, 
rhythm band selections; Group 
of fifth grade boys, tinkling; 
Alan Finney, a piano solo; Fifth 
grade, swing play.

The entire group presented

the school song, and Kristi 
Campbell led the recessional.

Students with perfect at­
tendance included: Third grade, 
Jana Brown, Nathan Lloyd, 
Genie Lopez, Shannon Pelton, 
Linda Recio, Kristi Taylor; 
Fourth grade, Beatriz Garcia, 
Mina Guillen, Zanna Huckaby, 
Ronnie Logsdon, Nina Sando­
val, Edward Soto, Jeff Vinson, 
Casey Wilson; Fifth grade, Matt 
Lee, Sheila Long, Janna Wuer­
flein, and Polly Harrison.

Yearly Honor Roll Students 
were: Third grade, Darren Al­
bertson. Brent Black, Jana 
Brown, Michelle Campbell, 
Mona Clark, Shannon Crazier, 
Kimberly Gardner, Lisa Hamil­
ton, Debra Isaac, Lance King, 
Casey King, Joey Kramer, Wal­
ter Leek, Mark Mata, Jana 
Milligan, Chris O'Donnell, Lin­
da Recio, Kristi Taylor, Lance 
Wemmohs.

Fourth grade, Courtney 
Brown, Donny Burris, Scott

Bookmobile!
News

By Lo rtR U  Sootur

The High Plains Bookmobile 
will be in your area on the 
following dates.

June 7-Whiteface #1-9:30 - 
11:00
Lehman, 11:05 - 11:30; Bledsoe, 
12:00- 1:30; Maple, 2:15-3:15. 

June 8
West Camp. 9:15 10:15; Lariat, 
10:30 - 11:30; Bovina, 12:30 - 
3:15.

June 9
Lums Chapel, 10:00 - 10:45; 
Spade, 12:00 - 1:30; Hart Camp, 
1:45 - 2:30; Fieldton, 2:45 - 3:30. 

June 10
Olton, 9:30 - 11:45; Amherst, 
1:15 - 3:30.

May we take this opportun­
ity to thank you for your 
cooperation.
Lorene Sooter, Bookmobile Li­
brarian

Calvert, Andy Copley, Jarrod 
Embry, Melessa Gabbert, Lau- 
rey Grant, Shawn Gist, Mike 
Harris, Mike Holt, Zanna Huck­
aby, Caice Hendrix, Wade 
King, Kristy Landers, Joanna 
Massingill, Gig Pierce, Mandy 
Plank, Sean Shipman, Sherri 
Stovall, Loy Triana, Kenneth 
Maxwell.

Coartfcoise
Maws

James A Kinard to Jim 
Pearson; S 1/2, SE 4, Section 
23, Block X. W.D. and F.W. 
Johnson's Subdivision.

Winnie Blanche Volkman 
Hurst to E.B. Gage; sections 36, 
and 37, Block Y. W.D. and F.W. 
Johnson's Subdivision.

J.E. Wilhite to Charles Ken­
neth Harvey; rectangular tract, 
35’ x 70', SW’ly 35’, Lot 8, 
Wilhite Subdivision, Block 1, 
Lakeside Addition.

Harvey Bass to Guadalupe 
Martinez; SE 115', Lots 3 and 4, 
Block 40.

Rodney D. Murphy to Lloyd 
N. Burlsen; 55’ x 140’, SW’ly 
30’, Lot 4, NE’erly 25’, Lot 5, 
Block 4, Lakeside Addition.

Marcus Gist to Jerry F. 
Bruns; 70' x 140’, Lot 58, SE’ly 
15', Lot 59, Richland Hills 
Addition.
MARRIAGE LICENSES
John Wesley Street and Becky 
Ann Franklin

Fifth grade, Rebecca Bar­
ber, Tamara Bean, Melanie 
Blackwell, Trish Burgess, Kristi 
Campbell, Lori Ellis, Adam 
Espinoza, Alan Finney, Hector 
Flores, Zonell Gatewood, Terry 
Graves, Kristi Heathington, 
Polly Harrison, Sherri Howard, 
John Isaac, Todd Jones, Laurie 
Kelton, Louise Lopez, Betsy 
Lunsford. Becky Mardis. Char­
lie Mata. Tammy Nowell, Vana 
Pruitt, Connie Puckett. Percila 
Quintana, Chad Robberson, 
Tina Ruthardt, Shelley Sain, 
Danny Sanchez, Barbie Seaton, 
Preston Scoggins, Dorinda Shaf­
er, Kristi Spies, Tracy Tunnell, 
Suzanne Williams and Janna 
Wuerflein. j

West Plains 
Medical 

Renter Briefs
ADMISSIONS
May 30-Berta DeLeon, Cruz 
Vasquez, Joaquin Carrasco, 
Mary Jo Walker, Christine
Howard.
May 31-Joan E. Johnson.
June 1-Billy Wayne Freeman. 
DISMISSALS
May 30-Marion Kittelson. Ollie 
C. Jones.
May 31--H.H. Carlyle, Ben Fos­
ter, Evette Freeman.
June 1-Calla Freedman, Ardath 
Glasscock.

Popular with teenagers is 
the new sandal with the resili­
ent roly poly sole. They’re 
recommended for casual wear.

An attractive summer cos­
tume consists of a smart, white 
knife-pleat shirt co-ordinated 
with a short-sleeve shirt set in 
stain-resistant polyester.

ONE MINUTE SPORTS QUIZ
1. Name the 1977 Horse of the 
Year.
2. Who won the Colonial 
National Invitation Golf Tour­
nament?
3. Mario Andretti is known 
what sport?
4. Name the winner of the 
LPGA Greater Baltimore Golf 
Classic.
Aaswars to Sports Qaii
1. Seattle Slew.
2. Lee Trevino.
3. Race car driver.
4. Nancy Lopez.

The Investment 

That Lets You Choose 
How Much You’ll Earn

EFFECTIVE JUNE 1,1978

NEW

ACCOUNT 

AVAILABLE 

JUNE 1st

NEW

ACCOUNT 

AVAILABLE 

JUNE 1st

NEW
ACCOUNT 
AVAILABLE 
JUNE 1st

ANNUAL ACCOUNT MINIMUM MINIMUM ANNUAL

INTEREST TYPE TERM DEPOSIT EFFECTIVE

RATE YIELD

5 '/ 4 % Passbook 5 . 3 9 %

5 3/ t % * Certificate *1.000.00 5 . 9 2 %

6 V f e % *  Certificate 1 Yeur '1.000.00 6 . 7 2 %

6 % % *  Certificate 2Vi  Y t ‘m*s *1.000.00 6 . 9 8 %

I W c *  Certificate 4 Years *1,000.00 7 . 7 9 %

I W r * Certificate 6 Y run- *1.000.00 8 . 0 6 %

m * Certificate 8 teiirv * 1.000.00 8 . 3 3 %
RAT?

BASED ON
4 O f I V  

ABOVE
US TREASURY 
BILLS PRIOR 

TO EVERY 
THURSDAY

•  Certificate 0 Miuitlif • 1 0 .0 0 0 .0 0

7 . % %
* RETIREMENT 

ACCOUNT 3 Yetir* 8 . 0 6 %

m
*  RETIREMENT 

ACCOUNT 8 Yettr* -------------* a 3 3 < *

*  FEDERAL REGULATIONS REQUIRE A PENALTY BE ASSESSED ON FUNDS 

WITHDRAWN PRIOR TO MATURITY RATE

WE HELP YOU SAVE FOR HAPPINESS AT THREE LOCATIONS
801 Pile Street, Clovis, New Mexico 88101, (505) 762-4417 

Prince and Parkland, Clovis, New Mexico 88101, (505)762-4417 
2nd and Abilene Streets, Portales, New Mexico 88130, (505) 356-4475

SAVINGS & LOAN ASSOCIATION o! CLOVIS

^  InrlrHonrlln^ flowing Oomiuunihj

i
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J Fsl SHURFINE

I  Bleach

^  39
LIPTON PURE

I n s t a n t  T e a
30Z.
JAR

$ 1 8 9

SHURFINE ASSTD. PAPER

N a p k i n s 2 60C T $  1  
PKGS. K

FOOD KING white 9"

P a p e r  P l a t e s
100 CT. W l 4 C  
PKGS.

SHURFINE COFFEE

C r e a m e r

8 9

8 9
16 0Z.m n4C
JAR

SHURFRESH REG /For DIPS

P e t a t e  C h i p s

SHURFINE MACARONI ft CHEESE

D i n n e r s

TWIN
8 0Z. 
PKG. 59
47% OZ.$ 1

BOXES I

SHURFINE FRUIT

C o c k t a i l 216 OZ. J t Q C
CAN S I f #

SHURFRESH SALTINE

C r a c k e r s 2 16 OZ. O Q C
BOXES 1 8  #

SH U RFIN E A SSTD . FLAVO R

Canned Pop

8™  *  i
CANS

SHURFINE 2 PLY BATHROOM

T i s s u e  ASSTD
8 ROLL 
PKG.

$ 1 3 9

SHURFINE POWDERED WHITE/BLUE

D e t e r g e n t 49 OZ. 
BOX 9 9

SHURFINE LIQUID PINK/LEMON

D e t e r g e n t
22 OZ. 
BTL. 5 9

SHURFINE FREE RUNNING/

S a l t  l0D,ZED 2 28 OZ. 7 0 *  
BOXES W  #

SHURFINE

V e g e t a b l e  O i l
24 OZ 

BTL. 9 9

SHURFINE ASSTD FRUIT

D r i n k s 2 46 0 2  7 0 *
CANS #  #

SHURFINE _  4 ^

A p p l e s a u c e  2 c a n s 6 9
16 OZ ^ U C  
C A N S ®

SHURFINE M ANDAR IN

O r a n g e s 211 o z O O c
c a n s Q  #

WE GIVE 
DOUBLE 

UNN BROS. 
STAMPS EVERY 
WED. & SAT.

Long White
Potatoes
CALIFORNIA

1 0  LB
BAG

SUGAR LOAF Larga Six*

P i n e a p p l e EACH 5 9

. CENTRAL AM ERICAN

[ B a n a n a s 4  $ 1T P  LBS. S

’ LONG GREEN SLICERS

^ C u c u m b e r s  LB 2 5 * |

1 0  LB. 
BAG 9 8

SHURFINE

C a t s u p
32 OZ. 
BTL.

onu  m 1111.

7 9 *  S a u c e

SHURFINE ASSTD SPAGHETTI ' 15% OZ. ‘ 
I JARS 1

ALL GRINDS VAC PAC

Sh u rfin e
Coffee • 2 4 9

CAN H H
SHURFINE

M u s t a r d

_  _  4 ^  SHURFINE

2  j a r !  6 9 *  A p p l e  B u t t e r 5 9
28 OZ. A t d C  
JAR

ALL PURPOSE

Sh u rfin e
F lou r O LB.

BAG 48
SHURFINE SALAD

D r e s s i n g

SHURFINE STRAW BERRY
32 OZ. 
JAR

^ _ 4 ^  a n u n n n c o in M n i

7 9  P r e s e r v e s 8 9
18 OZ. 
JAR

PURE VEGETABLE

Sh u rfin e
Sho rten in g *13948 OZ. m  

CAN ■
SHURFRESH VANILLA

W a f e r s

SHURFINE CRUNCHY/CREAMVg n u n n i i k  v n u n v n w  v n cn m r

2 p°k s 1  7 9 *  P e a n u t  B u t t e r 7 9
18 oz. ~#mAC
JAR

10* OFF LABEL DETERGENT

22 OZ. 
BTL. 78

SHURFINE GROUND

B l a c k  P e p p e r

SHURFINE HAMBURGER SLICED
4 OZ. 
CAN M  onunn ivc  nAMtsumitP

*  D i l l  P i c k l e s
32 OZ. 
JAR 6 9

Coca-Cola 
Dr. Pepper 6 BOTTLE 

CARTON
PLUS

DEPOSIT

SHURFRESH REG./BEEF

B o l o g n a
12 OZ. 
PKG. 9 9

SHURFRESH REG./BEEF

F r a n k s
12 OZ. 
PKG. 8 9

SHURFRESH SLICED LUNCHEON
M  m m B o lo g n a /B a a f  B o lo g n a /
M e a t s  P ic k le  b  P e p p r  L o a f /

T____salmi______
6oz.
PKG. 5 9

SHURFRESH CREAMY

P o t a t o  S a l a d
12 OZ. 
CTN. 5 9 }

SHURFRESH

C h i c k e n  S a l a d
8 OZ. 
CTN. 7 9

SHURFRESH-----------

H a m  S a l a d
8 OZ. 
CTN. 8 9

S H U R F R E S H

Boneless 
Ham

F U L L Y  C O O K E O  H A L V E S  
3 -4  LB . A V G

LB. *21 9

S H U R F R E S H

Canned
Ham

F U LL Y  C O O K E O  W IT H  N A T U R A L  — ■  
JU IC E S  b  G E L A T IN  A D D E D  ^  M l  j g O

3 LB S
C A N

SHURFRESH Pimanto/Jalapano

C h e e s e  S p r e a d

SHURFRESH v a c u u m  p a k  s l ic e d

B a c o n

7% OZ. 
CTN. 8 9

1 LB. $  
PKG. 1

39

SHURFRESH T H IC K  S L IC E D

B a c o n
2 LB. 
PKG.

$ 0 7 7

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF BLA0E

C h u c k  B e a s t  CUT LB. 9 9

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF B O N E L E S S

C h u c k  R o a s t
$ | 4 9

LB.

*

*

4
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
44
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*

COME TO PAY N ’ SAVE 
FOR YOU R W I C 

CARD PURCHASES

We Welcene

USD* FOOD 
ISTAMP COUPONS

SHURFINE GOLDEN W K OR CS

Corn
H W  d
m e »  ■ #

17 OZ. 
CANS

D a i l y  S p e c i a l

SHURFRESH BM  OR SM

B i s c u i t s
I 8 OZ. 
CANS 1

SHURFRESH QUARTERS SHURFRESH HALFMOON LONGHORN

M a r g a r i n e
B O R d / n  Vi gal.

M E L I A R I N E

| jn v n rn tu n  nMLrmuun u

p k g s  7 9 *  C o l b y  C h e e s e 9 9
10 oz. nnndC
PKG.

BORDEN 24 ox.
7 9 *  COTTAGE CHEESE 9 8

F t a ^ i  F c w d  S f m a f o
SHURFINE

S p i n a c h

SHURFINE FROZEN

L e m o n a d e
6 OZ. 
CANS 1

SHURFINE N O N  D A IR Y
W H IP P E D

--- SHUHUNt S P E A R S  O F

B r o c c o l i

SHURFINE CRINKLE CUT

P o t a t o e s

21 0 O Z . T Q <
p k g s  #  #

T o p p i n g
9 0Z. 

BOWLS 1

SHURFINE FROZEN 12 CT.

B l a i e d  D o n u t s
14 OZ. 
BOX 7 9

32 OZ. 
BAG

SHURFINE FROZEN b a t t e r  d i p p e dm  a  d n v n n n c  rnuc.cn a

7 9 *  F i s h  F i l l e t s
12 OZ. 
CTN. 9 9

[15 OZ. 
CANS

SHURFINE E A R L Y  H A R V E S T  4 ^  f k  ^

S w e e t  p e a s  3 ^ 8 9

H e a t ik  A i u l  B w u i i i j  A c d >
SHURFINE W H O L E  P E E L E D

Tomatoes 316 OZ. $  1
C AN S |

BAYER NASAL SPRAY

*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*

*1“IS
R  

*  
*  
*  

*  
*  
*

______________ _____________ _ _  4
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Aspirin _79‘50 CT. 
BTL.

BAYER CHILDREN S

Aspirin

3 0
36 CT
BTL. #

Vick's Sbtex
$  1 2 9

ViOZ.
BTL

V ICK’S

Nyq.il
iOZ ® 1

SHURFINE YC h a l v e s /

PeachesSUCiS 21 6 0 Z . 7 Q
C A N S #  #

SHURFINE C R U S H E D /S L IC E D

Pineapple 3 FLAT f i Q
CANS 1 8  #

SHURFINE CUT

Breen Beans 316 oz go
CANS 1 8  #

*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  

d *  
*  
*  
*  
*

SHURFINE TOMATO

Sauce 6 80Z. ^  1  
C AN S 9

SHURFINE PINK

Salmon 15 OZ. 
CAN

SHURFINE

Pork & Beans

@ 4 16 OZ 
CANS

4
i


