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It’s Beginning To Look Like Christmas

Robert Johnson, manager of 
the Farmer’s Co-op Elevator in 
Muleshoe said a blue corn 
producer meeting will be held at 
7 p.m. on Tuesday, December 
13, in the main office in 
Muleshoe.

If you are a blue com producer, 
or interested in becoming a blue 
com producer, you are encour­
aged to attend the meeting.

•**
Students of the Week and 

* receiving the principal’s award at 
Watson Junior High School were 
Jonathan Flores, sixth grade; 
Ruben Gonzales, seventh grade 
and Jolene Benavidez, eighth 
grade.

**•
The Muleshoe Youth Center 

will hold its annual Christmas
* Dance on Saturday, December 

17, 8 p.m.-12 midnight at the 
American Legion Hall.

Music will be by Scotty Snipes.
Admission will be three cans of 

food per person, or one toy, 
which will be distributed in the 
M uleshoe area through the 
Bailey County EMS Toys for Kids
Project.

a
Bailey County Commissioners 

will meet in regular session 
Monday, December 12 at 10 a.m.

After approving the minutes 
and payment of routine county 
bills, commissioners will consid­
er a budget amendment to 
FY1989 budget; review county 
treasurer report for November; 
review  departm ental reports; 
discuss compliance with voting 
laws for the handicapped and 
miscellaneous items.

a**
Bailey County EMS, who 

heads up the Toys for Kids 
project each year, has annnoun- 
ced a record-breaking nearly 200

* * youngsters lined up to receive
toys for Christmas 1988.

If you have toys in good 
condition, or jewelry, or items 
which would be useful for young 
teenage boys, to age 15, please 
take your .contribution to the 
Bailey County EMS at 715 West 
Second St.

Several local organizations are 
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HERE COMES SANTA CL4l75/-Traditionally ending the annual Christmas Parade in Muleshoe is the 
official first appearance of Santa Claus, who travels the parade route on one of the large fire trucks from 
the Muleshoe Fire Department. Last Saturday, it was no different, as he arrived, accompanied by a 
group of lucky youngsters. Santa later went to the Bailey County Civic Center to the Arts and Crafts 
Bazaar to visit with youngsters, and have his picture made with them. (Journal Photo)

Aging And Health Care Officer 
Wears More Than One Hat

(Editor’s note: In a continuing 
series, this is the latest story 
written especially for The Bailey 
County Journal and The Mule­
shoe Journal by Nora Joyce, 
journalism student from Texas 
Tech University. This series is 
made possible by a grant from 
the Readers Digest Foundation.)

Being head of three different 
subdivisions of the Bailey County 
Aging and Health Care office, 
Glen Williams finds himself 
fairly well occupied when he goes 
to work in the Bailey County 
courthouse.

As community service advisor 
for the Texas Department of 
Aging, Williams works with 
senior citizens, answering any 
questions they may have con­
cerning Social Security, Medi­
care, Medicaid, insurance and 
wills.

“ If I don’t have the answer, 
which is unlikely, I will find 
someone who does. That’s what

Anchor Brothers Band 
Release Newest Album

If you are ‘stuck’ trying to 
think what to give for a very 
’special’ Christmas gift this year 
-  just consider this!

Reydon Stanford of the Anchor 
Brothers Band proudly announ­
ces the release of the Anchor 
Brothers 10th album, “Hold Me 
For Awhile.”

It will be released next 
Thursday, December 15, just in 
time for Christmas.

Featured on the new album 
will be three new songs written 
by Reydon Stanford, along with a 
song by Dean Richards, son of 
Kenneth Richards, and another 
member of The Anchor Brothers 

% Band.
“Hold Me For Awhile, ” is the 

tenth album for the popular 
Sudan-based gospel group. The 
Anchor Brothers also released a 
single, the title song from their 
ninth album, "Back Seat Driv­
er. ” This is the first recording for 
The Anchor Brothers Band to be 
released nationwide.

'  The new single is l*«ted as No. 
eight at KJAK in Lubbock, is 
reported to be ‘charting’ (show­
ing up in top records played) in 
other cities across the nation.

This week, The Anchor Broth­
ers received a letter from a radio

station in North Carolina, which 
said, “ this is the best gospel 
record we have ever received.”

Nationwide^ promotion begins 
in January on the new single 
record. Southern Gospel Music of 
Tennessee, who recorded "Back 
Seat Driver, ” currently has the 
number one song in the nation, 
and have had several number one 
songs in the past.

“Hold Me For Awhile” is 
available on cassette, and can be 
purchased at Radio Station 
KMUL, Poynor’s and Little Gulf 
in Muleshoe.

Friday night, the second 30- 
minute program taped by The 
Anchor Brothers Band appeared 
on the PBS TV station in 
Lubbock. Stanford said they are 
working to get the program aired 
on the PBS TV station from 
Portales, which is received in 
Muleshoe, as the Lubbock PBS 
station cannot be received here.

The Anchor Brothers Band 
said they appreciate all the local 
and area support they have 
received in the years since they 
started performing their unique 
gospel music, and asked for your 
continued support and prayers 
for their success as they now go 
nationwide with their music.

my job is all about,” Williams 
says.

Established inT978, Williams' 
office has helped literally hun­
dreds of people with a wide 
variety of questions, the most 
common of which involve how to 
change one’s address on govern­
ment forms, how to file for 
Medicare/Medicaid, and what to 
do if a Medicare/Medicaid card 
is lost.

Williams also helps answer 
questions regarding estate settle­
ments and wills, and he will help 
write letters to the proper people 
or agencies that need to be 
addressed along these lines.

Williams’ duties also include 
running the Indigent Health Care 
program, which was established

Registrations 
For Community 
College Slated

Registration for the Spring 
sessions of the South Plains 
College Division of Continuing 
Education at the Muleshoe Com­
munity College Center will be 
Monday through Friday, January 
3*11, from 9 a.m.-4 p.m. in the 
office of the Assistant Superin­
tendent of Instruction, school 
administration building.

Spring classes will begin on 
Monday, January 16, 1989, with 
spring break March 20-24.

Books will be sold on the first 
night of class, and final exams 
will be given May 8-11.

Elizabeth Watson, Assistant 
Superintendent of Instruction, 
said a minimum enrollment of 
fifteen persons is required for a 
course to be conducted.

Cost is given first for semester 
hours in-state, followed by 
out-of-state.

Three, $63 and $233; four, $79 
and $239; six, $111 and $251; 
seven, $127 and $267; nine, $159 
and $339; and 10, $175 and $375.

Classes scheduled for the 
spring session are HST 232-45, 
History of U. S. Since 1876, 
Monday, 6:30-9:30 p.m. at high 
school; ENG 132-45, College 
Composition and Rhetoric (Pre­
requisite: English 131), Tuesday, 
6:30-9:30 p.m., high school; PSY 
231-45, General Psychology, 
Thursday, 6:30-9:30, high school; 
and ACC 232-45, Principles of 
Accounting II (Prerequisite: ACC 
231, Principles of Accounting !), 
Thursday, 6:30-9:30 p.m.

Snow., Ice Temporarily 
Slow Down Area Traffic

in Bailey County in 1986. The 
county com m issioners’ court, 
fnder Texas law, is responsible 
for the indigent people of his 
respective county if they have no 
coverage by M edicare, and 
application for this service is 
made through Williams’ office.

A mandate passed two years 
ago with the establishment of 
this program says that to be 
eligible for the health care 
program one must be a resident 
of the county where they apply, 
and not possess more than $1,500 
equity in a car and home 
combined, and no more than 
$1,000 worth of other resources. 
Basic health care will be provided 
to the person if they are eligible.

Williams also serves as Bailey 
County’s Veterans’ Service Offi­
cer. After World War n , the 
Texas legislature mandated that 
each County Commission should 
appoint a Veterans Service 
Officer to help veterans and their 
fam ilies with any questions 
concerning their legal rights and 
privileges as veterans. In this 
capacity, Williams helps with 
such things as widows’ benefits, 
survivors’ benefits, pensions, 
hospitalization information and
Cont. Page 6, Col. 4

GED Testing 

Next Weekend 
At High School

The General Educational De­
velopment (GED) test will be 
given in Muleshoe on Friday, 
December 16, and Saturday, 
December 17, at Muleshoe High 
School.

Individuals interested in test­
ing for a certificate of high school 
equivalency will need to be 
present at both testing sessions.

The following requirements 
apply to interested persons:

1. Minimum age is 18, but a 17 
year old is eligible with parental 
or guardian consent.

2. Must be a resident of Texas. 
m 3. Must be officially witlidrawn 
from school and must not have 
received a high school diploma 
from an accredited high school in 
the United States.

Testing will begin at 5:30,p.m. 
on Friday and continue at 8:30 
a.m. on Saturday.

Further information ma? be 
obtained by calling Linda Marr, 
GED Test Administrator, at 
Muleshoe High School. 272-3080.

If people were not in ‘The 
Christmas Spirit’ before Thurs­
day, they couldn’t have helped 
but think more about Chrisimas 
as snow fell all day on Thursday 
in the Muleshoe area.

With a fairly stiff wind, 
conditions were almost blizzard­
like throughout the day, slowing 
traffic to a crawl through most of 
the day.

The area’s first traffic accident 
occurred shortly before midnight 
Wednesday when a semi-truck

Mighty ‘M’ 
Band Concert 
Set Saturday

It is once more the time of year 
in which we think of sharing and 
giving to others. It is a time for 
gathering with friends and rela­
tives. It is a time for caroling and 
for the long-awaited Christmas 
concert.

This year, the concert will be 
held on Saturday, December 17, 
7:30 p.m. in the high school 
auditorium. It will include the 
Watson Junior High Cadet and 
Intermediate bands and the 
Muleshoe High School Mighty 
“ M” band.

The Mighty “ M” will play 
severer songs. They are: The 
Glory o f Christmas-Jennings; 
Slavonic Folk Suite-Reek; Sleigh 
Ride-Anderson; Christmas Sing 
A/ortg-Handal; Adoration and 
Praise-Smith.

During the sing-along, the 
audience will be invited to sing 
along with the band.

In an effort to help needy 
people during this special time of 
the year, DECA will be collecting 
cans of food at the door before 
the concert. Any donations to 
help the less fortunate will be 
greatly appreciated, but a dona­
tion is not required to attend the 
concert.

The Mighty “ M” Band and 
DECA appreciate your support in 
this endeavor. So come and enjoy 
yourself on Saturday, the 17th, at 
7:30 p.m., and do not forget to 
bring a can of food with you.

See you there and Merry 
Christmas!!

load of liquor was overturned 
approximately two and a half 
miles east of Muleshoe on 
Highway 84.

The 56-year old driver of the 
truck was brought by Bailey 
County EMS to West Plains 
Medical Center in Muleshoe for 
em ergency treatm ent before 
being transferred to Clovis.

Officers directing traffic at the 
accident, along with members of 
the Muleshoe Fire Department 
and EMS personnel, found road 
and weather conditions ‘less than 
ideal’ and caution was being 
urged radio-to-radio as additional 
emergency personnel were called 
out to assist at the accident site.

Traffic was re-routed for a 
couple of hours while the 
accident was investigated, and 
while waiting for a large wrecker 
from Clovis to make its way to the 
accident to set the truck upright 
and remove it from the complete­
ly blocked eastbound lanes of the 
highway.

Several accidents were report­
ed in the City of Muleshoe 
beginning around mid-afternoon 
on Thursday. Although vehicles 
were banged up and many had to 
be removed by wreckers, no 
additional injuries were reported.

Schools in Muleshoe started an 
hour later than usual both 
Thursday and Friday, and the 
school buses traveled only on 
pavements picking up youngsters 
for school.

Friday morning, after a low of 
nine degrees, the sufl came out 
and quickly started melting the 
four inches of snow that had 
fallen.

By late afternoon Friday, the 
roads and most sidewalks were 
mostly cleared, with only a few 
icy spots remaining by Saturday 
morning.

However, freezing rain and 
snow were predicted for the 
weekend. At presstime, cloudy 
skies were the rule, but the 
temperature at 8 a.m. was an 
almost balmy 32 degrfees.

National Weather Service of 
Lubbock predicted a 70 percent 
chance of snow with accumula­
tions of one to two more inches of 
snow for Saturday. Saturday 
night, the prediction carried a 40

Cont. Page 6, Col. 6

KNOCKING OUT A LITTLE EXERCISE-- Wei 1. this was exercise that 
probably hadn’t been planned earlier in the week. However, this 
young woman on West Fifth Street was busy shoveling out a 
driveway Friday morning, after the sun came out. More snow was 
predicted for the weekend. (Journal Photo)
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Dear

Santa Letters

bear Santa Claus, 
j I would like for you to bring me 
a present. I would like for you to 
bring me a Christmas tree. I 
Would like to give you a candy 
cane. I would like to give you a 
picture of me. 1 would like to give 
you a bird. I would like for you to 
bring me a present.
Love,
Pewayne Pedigo 
kindergarten

•**
Dear Santa Claus,

Would you bring me a bike? 
Justin Johnson 
kindergarten

***

Dear Santa Claus,
Happy Birthday. Bring me a 

little Christmas tree, 
pove,
Lori Luna 
kindergarten

**•

Isotoner
Gloves
14.95

Reg. 25.00

nou s ^
R* s lio p

l 502 Main .

Dear Santa Claus,
Merry Christmas Santa Claus l 

I want a toy Big Foot. I want 
some Nintendo games.
Love,
David Morris 
kindergarten

Dear Santa,
I want a bike and some skates. 

1 also want a backpack. Help my 
grandmother’s friend to get 
better.

Thank You 
Diana Gable

P.S. 1 also want a keyboard. 
•**

Dear Santa,
I have been very good this 

year. 1 want a my child for 
Christmas. And I want double 
dare and I want a Nintendo and a 
new telephone. I would finders 
keepers and mouse trap. A 
barbie day Bed and the California 
dream barbies. And the barbie 
with crimped hair. And 1 want a 
baby Chihuahua dog too! And a 
big streao. With a remot control. 
And I want jeans and jogging 
suits.
Yours truly,
Aimee Hugg 
9 years old 
Dear Santa, ***

My name is Kandy and I 
am 9 years old. 1 have been sort 
of good and sort of bad. This year 
for Christmas I would like a 
telephone of my own, a pocket 
rocker, Double Dare, 100 dollars. 
Please bring my mother and dad 
a new car or pick-up. I also want 
a Nintendo. I don’t know what 
my sister or teacher wants.

Sincerley,
Kandy Wilcox 

•**
Dear Santa

What 1 want for Christmas is a 
Nintedo with Russan Ate and 
Skate or Die. I want you to get my 
mom a School Job as a Teacher. I 
want you to get my Dad a new 
shope so he can work in a clean 
shope instead of a durty. I also 
want you to get my sister a new 
sits for my her car If 1 was good 
this year if 1 wasent 1 am sorry. 
Age 9
Colemen Strahan 

Dear Santa,
1 have been looking forward to 

Christmas. This year I want a 
cabbage paltch toddler a cabbage 
patch playpen, garfield hooks 
and stamps. I am nine yean old.

My little sister Laura wants a 
Double Dare game. My other 
sister Jackie probably wants 
something but I don’t know what 
it is. My biggest sister Jodie 
wants a calculator. I have been 
good this year. Tell Mrs. Claus 1 
said hello, tell the reindeers too. 1 
love you.
Love Sarah Freeman 

• • •
Dear Santa,

1 would like a Bouncing Baby, 
Dress N Dazzle and a play 
Camera.

Thank You,
- Amanda Foster

Dear Santa,
I love you 1 like your elves. 1 

love your sleigh. I want a four 
wheeler play motorcycle for 
outside. My mom wants a 
camcorder. .My dad needs a 
b) and new shirt.

Thank You, 
Dan Williams

Dear Santa,
Please let me have an apple. 

Bring me a present that has 
candy and a necklace in it. Also 
bring me another present-a  
rabbit. Can I have another 
present with dolls in it? Bring my 
mom a present too. Bye

Matilde Arellano 
• • •

Dear Santa,
1 want a bike I also want a 

scooter and a Miss Make up girl.
I want a toy angel.

Thank You 
Lisa Johnson

*•*
Dear Santa,
Dear Santa,

I want a bike. I also want a 
Barbie doll and some stars. Bring 
my mom a baby. Bring my dad a 
rabbit. Bring the baby a picture 
and a teddy bear. Bring me a 
backpack.

Thank You 
Monica Olveda

***
Dear Santa,

What I want for Christmas is 
crackers in my bed, a deer that 
sings, a stuffed monkey, a play 
radio, and that’s all.

Good-Bye, Santa 
Rita Villalobos

**•
Dear Santa,

Merry Christmas! I want one 
of those toy kitchens. My moit^ 
wants a ring and my dad wants a

Dear Santa,
I want a computer for 

Christmas and one of those cars 
that look green when you turn off 
the light. I want a race car and a 
dog puppet that talks. Also I 
want some Kung Fu pants. Bring 
me a vampire and a puppy for my 
mom. Also 1 want a dinosaur.

Thank You, 
Javier Daniel

• • •
Dear Santa,
1 would like a remote control 
parcha. And a Nintendo. And 
Double Dare, And a guitar with 
amp. And a V.C.R. And some 
cassettes with a big stero And 
every thing in the world excepted 
Girl Stuff Just boy Stuff.
Your friend Joey Chavez 
Age nine

*•*

Dear Santa,
I want one of those playdoughs

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Kevin Turpin and Shannon 

Springfield, Muleshoe 
Alyo De Los Santos Arrambide 

and Maria Amalia Jimenez, 
Muleshoe

Sean Lee Shipman and Deana 
Louise Lee, Muleshoe

WARRANTY DEEDS 
Charles L. Glover and wife, 

Ellen Jo Glover to David W. Bray 
and wife, Shelby E. Bray—A 500 
Acre tract of land out of the 
(NE/4) of Section (56), Block Z, 
WD&FW Johnson Subdivision, 
Bailey County, Texas.

COUNTY COURT 
Apalonio Cortez, DWI, 3 

Days Jail. $250 Fine
Donald Adoulph Marlow, Driv­

ing While License Suspended, 
72 Hours Jail, $100 Fine 

Ricardo Alarcon, DWLS, 72 
Hours Jail, $100 Fine 

Cesario Sanchez Rodriguez, 
DWLS, 72 Hours Jail, $100 Fine 

DISTRICT COURT 
Judi Viola Nickell and 

William Arthur Nickell, DV 
T.L. Timmons VS Watson 

Alfalfa, Inc., Order Denying 
Summary Judgment

that make food. I want a bicycle. 
Thank you for giving me these 
toys, Santa Claus. Thank you for 
coming to our house. Where do 
you live? Do you live up in the 
sky?

Thank You 
• Lisa Marie Ramirez

P.S. I also want a chalkboard. 
• • •

Dear Santa,
Bring me a present. I would 

like a dinosaur. Also 1 would like 
some race cars. Also 1 would like 
a toy Santa Claus. My mom 
needs some make up and my dad 
needs a headband and dinosaur.

Thank You 
Fabian Fabela

•**
Dear Santa,

1 would like a bubble lawn 
mower. Please bring my mom a 
diamond bracelet. My dad needs 
a fish deal that goes in the 
bottom of the boat so he will 
know that a fish is close. My 
sister sure does want a doll 
stroller. Get my grandmother 
some clothes and my pa-pa a new 
belt.

Thank You, 
Jordan Pool

Read the Classifieds

JOHN DEERE II111
( t v

Deere Delights 
for Christmas \

JOHN DEERE TOY HEADQUARTERS

p *

fl %

‘ • f j M K i l j

World’s Largest Christmas Stocking 
*800 Value Refrigerator

t __
Register For Both At Thriftway

We Will Draw For Both On Dee. 17th At MAC Drawing. 
You Need Not Be Prewent To Win.

42 oz.
POWDER DETERGENT

tit J

GS>
S IN G H S

AMERICAN 
16 oz.

KRAFT SINGLES
$439

22 oz.

GLASS PLUS
w/Trigger

*129

QUAKER

OAT
SQUARES

$189

1 gal.
SHUR SAVING

FABRIC SOFTENER

994

FRESH

P0INSETTIAS

699

CLEO'S
CHRISTMAS 

WRAPPING PAPER

V l
I k

fehriftujai
illWFFlUATED 

FOODS INC.
MfMttKSIOM l

WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS...Wf RESERVE TNI RIGHT TO UNIT

_____ _ k



J Before hanging strings of lights. 
spread them on the floor and check for 

frayed or bare wires, tracked insula- 
tion. loose connections, and damaged 

plugs or light sockets.

]  Check extension cords for 
wear or damage and don't run ■{

them across walking areas.

]  Tfest lights before putting them on the 
tree. Unplug them before making repairs 

or replacing bulbs.

]  Overloading circuits with too many 
lights can cause fire. Follow manufac­

turer's instructions about the number 
of lights allowed on one circuit.

]  Choose a fresh, green tree, trim its 
base and keep it in plenty of water. If the 

needles are brown and break off 
easily, it could be a fire risk.

]  If you buy an artificial tree, make sure 
it has been tested for flammability by 

Underwriters Laboratories (UL).

3 Place your tree away from the 
fireplace or other heat sources 

and out of the traffic pattern.

]  Never string lights on a metallic 
tree. Light strings with damaged insulation 

can electrically charge a metallic tree. 
Instead, shine unattached colored floodlights 

or spotlights on the tree.

3 Always turn off lights before leaving 
home or going to bed. You'll save money 

and be safer, too.

3 Never use lighted candles on a tree or 
near evergreens And don't burn ever­

greens in the fireplace.

3 Do not use inside lights on the outside 
All outside lighting equipment, including 

lights, cords and plugs, should be 
waterproof and made for outdoor use.

Also, hang sockets downward and 
don’t leave a socket empty.

]  When hanging lights on the rooftop v 
or in tall trees outdoors, stay dear of 

electrical lines. Make sure you or 
your decorations don’t come . A

in contact with them.

3 Should you receive a CB radio or "  
television this Christmas, let a qualified 

serviceman install the CB base unit 
or television antenna for you.

This delicate job is best left to the 
professionals.

3  Be sure electrical toys are tested for 
safety. Look for the UL mark.

Wishing You A Safe 
Happy Holiday

SOUTHWESTERN
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Sudan A eu r ,
iB j: tivelyn R itchie

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Jack 
Markham were in Littlefield 
Thanksgiving Day for dinner with 
Mr. and Mrs. Noel Lumpkin. 
They attended an art show in
Odessa over the weekend.

*•*
Thanksgiving Day guests in 

the home of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Williams were Bob Williams and 
Jim W illiams of M edicine 
Mound, Gena Gustin of Austin
and Johnny Nelson of Big Spring. 

*•*
Mr. and Mrs. Bo Lance and 

(iris visited during the Thanks­
giving holidays with her family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Gillett and 
family in Baird.

Mr. and Mrs. David Quisen- 
berry and girls visited during the 
holidays in Tahoka with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
McKibbon and family and in 
Lockney with his pac.rnts, Mr. 
and Mrs. Denny Quisenberry and 
family.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. Roland Bellamy 

and their son, Mr. and Mrs. Ron 
Bellamy and All, 1̂1 of Wichita 
Falls and Dr. Merlyn Bellamy of 
McAlister, Okla. were holiday 
visitors with their mother, Edna 
Bellamy.

**•
Bill Gardner of San Angelo 

visited during the holidays with 
his mother, Mrs. Frances Gard­
ner and other family members. 

*«*
Oleta Reece took her mother, 

Mrs. Dudgeon back to Post 
following a visit here with Oleta 
and Mrs. Winona Dudgeon and 
other family members.

Holiday visitors with Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray May were their sons, 
Mr. and Mrs. Kenzil May of 
Odessa, M.rand Mrs. Larry May 
of Garden City and family, MLr. 
and Mrs. Reagan May of North 
Carolina.

# '  ' • #

Ruff H ewn
* r i  . .

J e a n s
’ 0  0  0

50% Off

420 Main

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. R.B. Knox have 

returned from vacationing during 
ihe holidays in East Texas. The 
Bill Kuykendalls visited there
with his mother also.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Tollett 

have returned from vacationing 
during the Thanksgiving holidays 
in Alexandria, VA with their 
nephew, Bryan Tollett and also in 
Maryland and Washington D.C. 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Tollett and

their granddaughter, Jolene of 
Rogers, N.M . accompanied  
them.

• • •
Shirley Martin and family 

spent the Thanksgiving holidays 
in Seminole with family and 
friends.

It was reported that Craig 
Walser has been released from 
the Methodist Hospital following 
heart surgery recently and is 
recuperating at the home of his

mother, Rubilee.
•a*

Barbara Flowers has been a 
medical patient in the Littlefield 
hospital this week.

Robert W ells of Topeka, 
Kansas is visiting this week with 
his dad, Clayton Wells and 
sisters, Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Doty and Mr. and Mrs. Glen 
Chester.

Enochs News
by: Mrs. J.D. Bayleas

s anta Letters
Dear Santa Claus,

I want a Big Foot and a 
motorcycle. I want a football hat, 
pads and suit. Don’t bring my 
toys here. I won’t be here. 1 will 
be in Vernon.
Love
Bryan King

Dear Santa Claus,
I would like a scooter and a 

remote control car. And a Ghost 
Buster car. That’s all.
Bryan Lewis 
kindergarten

• • •
Dear Santa Claus,

I want to get a robot, a toy ring 
and a telephone. And a bike. I’m 
going to get a skateboard and a 
Mr. McGruff and a teddy bear. I 
like you. And a treehouse.
Love,
Johnny Torsun 
kindergarten

Dear Santa,
I want a shirt, a pair of pants 

and a toy car.
Damian Garcia 
kindergarten

Dear Santa,’
I want a choo-choo train, a 

tractor, (I hope I get a fat one-a 
John Deere), cars and trucks (I 
want them to be micro machines) 
And that’s all.
Arturo Perez 
kindergarten

**•
Dear Santa,

I want a baby doll, some new 
clothes, and that’s all 
Crystal Scott w 
kindergarten

*•*
Dear Santa,

I want a Mickey Mouse toy and 
I am going to give you a toy deer.
1 also want a candycane, a santa 
toy, a pony with wings, you prees 
that button and it flies. Also 
Barbie clothe, my Barbie doesn't 
have any and a real horsie. A toy 
cow and ugh, a turkey, a Mr. 
McGruff toy and a lamb toy, a 
cage with a parrot, a pig, a little 
playing giraffe and a playing 
monket too. And real crayolas 
that write and some little real 
kitties, a medium Xmas tree, a 
cat house a toy telephone and a

RCA 26 diagonal
XL-100 Color TV
• ChanneLock digital remote control
• Hl-Con’- square-corner 110* COTY  

picture tube
• 147-channel cable-compatible 

tuning*
• Auto-Programming
• On-screen channel number display

*5980 0

desk, and I want to be a teacher 
when I grow up. Also a waterbed, 
and flowers.
Rhea Gonzales 
kindergarten

• • •

race car track, a 
truck and that’s

Dear Santa 
I want

football, a toy 
all.
Westin Price 
kindergarten

Dear Santa,
I Love You. I want a pocket 

rocker and that’s all.
Crystal Chilton 
kindergarten

*•*
Dear Santa,

I want a book, and give me a 
Cabbage Patch doll, and that’s 
all.
Sabrina Sierra 
kindergarten

•*«
Dear Santa,

I want a toy, some shoes, nail 
polish, and press on nails. 
Melicia Franco 
kindergarten

Dear Santa,
give me a present, and buy me a 
dog. And a cat. That's all. 
Poncho Marrufo 
kindergarten

Dear Santa Claus,
I want a sled. I want a doll. I 

want a blue car. That’s all.
Love,
Myndi Heathington 
kindergarten

• • •
Dear Santa Claus,

1 want a real playhouse and 
little jeep that will drive with me 
in it. Some new jeans and socks 
and some new panties. That’s all. 
Merry Christmas.
Love,
Jamie Prather 
kindergarten

**•
Dear Santa Claus,

I want a guitar and a train, 
Nintendo, a remote control car, a 
dog and a toy reindeer, a toy 
truck and a toy monkey. Thank 
you. Jake Pickering
Love kindergarten

, Mrs. J.E. Layton was in 
Lubbock to be with her sister, 
Mrs. J le ta  Burris as she 
underwent surgery at Methodist 
Hospital Wednesday.

We express our sympathy to 
the family of Mrs. Belle Calvert 
of Lubbock formerly of Enochs. 
Her graveside service was at tlhe 
Enochs Cemetery following the 
service refreshments was served 
for them at the Baptist Church.

Mrs. Ellen Bayless and Mrs. 
Winnie Byars was in Muleshoe 
Thursday on business and visited 
Mrs. Clara Coffman.

***
Visitors at the Baptist Church 

Sunday were Mrs. Nova Louise 
Thomas of Smyer and Miss 
Darlene Elliott. Miss Elliott 
showed slides of the country and 
her work in Columbia where she 
was a missionary for 36 years. 
They visited in the home of Rev. 
and Mrs. Davis Graves and 
family. **•

Mrs. Irma Roberts of Lubbock 
visited in the Bill Key home 
Thursday morning.

Cindy and Don Hatsfield of 
Amarillo are the parents of a 
daughter. Cindy is a niece of the 
Bill Keys’.

DECEMBER:

of the month

Friday dinr sr guest in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Dale 
Nichols was her brother, Reger 
Sandefer from Valdossa, 
Georsia •**

Mr. and Mrs. E.N. McCall 
visited relatives in Portales, 
N.M. Saturday and drove on to 
Clovis, N.M. and did some 
shopping.

Mrs. Wnma Petree of Lubbock 
attended the graveside service of 
Mrs. Belle Calvert Friday at 
Enochs and spent the night with 
Mrs. Ellen Bayless. She visited 
in the home of the Dale Nichols 
and Mrs. Etta Layton Saturday 
morning.

Vise-Grip 
Set 

Reg. 2 1 .4 9

$9.97
Sale Price 

3 .00  
R ebate

contains one 10" and 
one 5" locking pliers
$ 6 .9 7  Final Cost

Higginbotham
Bartlett Co.

2 1 5  Main

C h eck  S a fe ty  M a k e

n  s THE GODFATHER. IN MULESHOE IN PERSON-Lsst 
Saturday, one of the cars in the annual Christmas parade featured 
“ The Godfather.” However, if we didn’t know better, we would 
swear the smiling gentleman, waving to the crowd from the front 
seat, was none other than Muleshoe’s Harvey Bass. (Journal Photo)

ModM VR463

RCA 4-Head VCR
• 4-head "Double Azimuth" video 

system
• Jitter-free “field-still” special 

effects
• Remote programming 

with on-screen display 
(4 event/1 yr)

• 110-channel FS  quartz tuning*
• Auto programming tuner
• Wireless remote control
• On-screen status display

•G uaran teed  NotionaSy 
fEW C  Electronic*

Wilson
117 Main Appliances, Inc. 272-5531

It  iM iif f lr f lL  I i iin l

PUBLIC SERVICE 
COMPANY

4 »*
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Justine xtyaw : uMomed (D̂  _AAondi
The members of the Muleshoe 

Branch of the American Associa­
tion of University Women an­
nounce Justine Hanes as the 
December Girl of the Month. 
Justine is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Hanes and is a 
senior at Muleshoe High School.

She has been active in Student 
Council, serving as an honorary 
member her freshman, sopho­
more and junior years, and as 
reporter this year. She is 
president of the National Honor 
Society. Justine is Co-editor of 
the Mule’s Tale. As a junior, she

was a state qualifier for State 
Extemporaneous Speaking. She 
received the Library and Journal­
ism awards as a junior and the 
Algebra I Award as a sophomore.

“ This very active young lady 
lists as her hobbies water skiing, 
listening to the radio and being 
with her friends” said a 
spokesperson from AAUW.

Justine is an employee at 
Bentley’s Department Store and 
plans to attend North Texas State 
University and major in Public 
Communications.

“ Congratulations to Justine 
from the members of AAUW on 
her selection as December Girl of 
the Month.”

JUSTINE HANES

Bailer County Journal US PS 040 20U

Established March 31. 1963. Published by Muleshoe Publishing Co" 
Inc. Every Sunday at 304 W. Second. Box 449. Muleshoe. Texas 
79347. Second C ass  Postage paid at Muleshtoe. Texas 79347.
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Daisy scouts met Wednesday 
afternoon, Dec. 7 at the Girl 
Scout Hut. Daisies opened the 
meeting with the Girl Scout 
Promise and the Pledge.

It was reported that this week 
the Daisies learned how to make 
and decorate Christmas cookies. 
Which they enjoyed eating with 
' e refreshments that Karen Jo 

Wimberley took.
Those present included: Misty 

Garcia, Stephanie Kirk, Eliza­
beth Torres, Casey Tosh, Lisa 
Marie Ramirez, Jamie Prather, 
Kinsee Estep, Melissa Flores, 
Kayla Claybrook, Chyla Torres, 
Shari Alanis, Adrienne Ashford, 
Diana Gable, and Karen Jo 
Wimberley. The leaders are 
Cherry Estep, Linda Tosh, Linda 
Flores and Mary Ann Ramirez.

Plain living and high thinking are 
no more.

—William Wordsworth.

M  fW E"i«
C h r i s t m a s ,

SCOUT TROOP NO. 228-Brow  ie Girl Scout Troop No. 228 pose 
with Five Area Telephone’s (Telephone) entry in the Christmas 
parade. (From Left) Jennifer Castorena, Angel Castorena, Dee Dee 
Morris, Tori Tosh and Nikki Atkins. Seated: Cynthia Villarreal.

(Guest Photo)

Local Women Members O f SP A lum ni

FREE HEARING TESTS FOR SENIOR CITIZENS

«
.
»

WESTERN DRUG MULESHOE 
114 MAIN

Wednesday, December 14,1988
COME BY OR CALL 272-3106 9-.30 o in. - 10:30 o.m. 

10 DAY FREE TRIAL 12 BRANDS 10 CHOOSE FROM 
SATISFACTION GUARANTEED

Sponsored tey

^ R S S T qk ' 
HEARING A I0 ) J

c e n t o - y

1903 I9TM 
LUBBOCK TX 

79401
806 763 3951

606 B Q U IN O  
PlA IN V tiW  TX 

79073
806 393 8874

RICHARD R. DAVILA 
C IR T IfllD  H fARM G 

AID AUDIOLOGIST

Four local women, Carrie L. 
Bishop, Barbara Hinkson Lusk, 
Kandy McWorter and Arline B. 
Phelps, are among the 136 
members of the South Plains 
Alumni and Associates College of 
Home Economics, Texas Tech 
University.

The South Plains Alumni and 
Associates are persons within a 
twenty county area who have 
attended the College of Home 
Economics at Texas Tech Univei 
sity and others who wish to 
support the college.

SPAA’s purposes include pro­
viding service and support for the 
quality educational programs in 
Home Economics at Texas Tech, 
to provide opportunities for 
personal enrichment and/or pro­
fessional updating for former 
students of the College of Home 
Economics, as well as to make it 
possible for former students to 
renew college friendships and to 
make new friends through .‘a 
networking opportunity.

New officers elected  for 
19188-1989 include: Angela  
Boren, Lubbock, president;

Old-Fashioned Service
T O  O U R

New-Fangled Farmers
Farming’s changed a lot over the years—from  
horse-drawn plow s to  high-tech m achinery and  
scientific  m ethods. B ut one thing hasn’t changed  
a b it—our dedication to bringing you the friend­
liest and b est financial services in the county. 
Stop in and see  us for all your banking needs.

m

ESHOI
202 S. 1st M em b er F.D .I.C .

Catherine Crawford, Lubbock, 
vice president; Mary Reeves, 
Lubbock, treasurer; Pauline 
Bean, Lubbock, secretary; and 
Beverly Thomas, Denver City, 
historian.

Membership is open to all who 
are > nterested in College of Home 
Economics at Texas Tech. For 
information about membership 
you may contact Carolyn Hard­
ing, 3101 79th St. Lubbock, 
Texas, 79407 or call (806) 
799-1219.

SPAA assisted the College of 
Home Economics this fall with 
Homecoming by hosting re­
unions by the decade. Future 
activities will include participa­
tion in Home Economics Aware­
ness Week in March 1989, the 
Annual Meeting April 1, 1989, 
and assisting with preparations 
for honoring 50 year graduates in 
May 1989.

To live is like to love—all reason 
is against it, and all healthy instinct 
for it.

—Samuel Butler.

This time of year the maga_ 
zines are filled with pictures ot 
clean, beautifully dressed, calm, 
smiling children happily play g 
with their Christmas toys.

That may be one reason why 
parents become frustrated or 
even angry when their children 
fuss, whine or misbehave during 
holiday celebrations.

“ Young children will respond 
differently to Christmas activities 
depending on their age,” said 
Dr. Sarah Anderson, a child 
development expert and mother 
of three.

“ Parents can save themselves 
a lot of grief by knowing what is 
normal and predictable behavior 
from young children and plan­
ning their family activ ities  
accordingly,” she said.

Anderson, who is a family life 
specialist with the Texas Agri­
cultural Extension Service at 
Texas A&M University, sug­
gested parents consider the 
following:

•Babies under 12 months can 
easily feel overwhelmed by too 
many toys, relatives or food. Give 
the baby plenty of rest and time 
alone with you.

•Toddlers will be lovable and 
cute, but not too involved in 
Christmas. Some toddlers will be 
fearful of strangers, including 
visiting relatives. Child-proof 
your Christmas decorations, 
since toddlers will want to touch 
hot lights, pull on electrical cords 
and handle decorations that 
arouse their curiosity.

•Two-year-olds will be excited

about the lights and decoration 
They can’t anticipate, so they 
can’t wait to open gifts or eat 
cookies and they may throw 
tantrums to prove it. Two-ye*,. 
olds are just as likely to play Wft|, 
the box as the toy inside an<̂  
since they don’t share well yet 
will often hit and grab toys.

•Three-year-olds will ^  
gifts, both the box and the gift 
inside. They’re more likely to 
have a sunny disposition on 

.Christmas and be able to piay 
with other children. So getting 
together with relatives may be| 
easier. However, parents win 
still want to limit the extent of 
activ ities . Any three-year-old 
who has been too excited for too 
long is capable of fighting and 
acting out.

•Four-year-olds can remember 
well and anticipate activities. 
They love the holidays, including 
parties and events, especially if* 
they’re not too long. They can 
participate in decorating and 
other simple projects in advance 
of Chritmas. In general they 
should get along with visiting 
relatives, but may sometimes be 
rude and uncooperative when 
tired or overextended.

•Five-year-olds will show 
marked improvement in behavior 
because they are beginning to set 
their own limits. This is an ideal 
year to read about Christmas to 
them. Since they like to help and 
do things alone, it’s also a good 
year for projects. This may also 
be the first year for really liking 
Santa. ■ " -*

< ►

Head Into W inter 
W ith An Exciting 

New Look!!
Come In Monday

December 12th. ^ ___ 
And Get A Perm, Hair Cut

And Style For $27.50
Ana’s House of Beauty

109 Ave. B 272-4152

272-45151

25% Off
SALE

Take an Additional 25% OFF 
Our Yellow Tag Merchandise!

fcXAMHt 
o r i g i n a l  P R » c l

$ 3 0
Y t U O W  3 * G*25

NOW

1 2 3 0

• l> on not in c lu d . »M i.»  Hock. A p p lln  only to y»«ow t ,f  
m .rc h .n d b . M m  L ln M  lo  iM n h im R w  m  m N . SH nU on 
"M y yayy by H or*.

OFF-
Y etto* T09
Merchandise

S u n d a y ,  M ° n^  ,

&  T u e s d a y  O n l y !

f a l l  &  W a t e r  M e r c ^ i

Sorry...no layaways.

»321 Main

A N IH O N Y I
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MULESHbH 
110 Main 272-41 

'9-7 Mon.-SaL * 
Closed Sunday

A BIG. BIG MULESHOE WELCOME 7'0-Dr. Lawrence and Carolyn Ward. Dr. 
and Mrs. Ward recently moved to Muleshoe when he accepted the position of 
Superintendent of Schools for the MISD. His wife, Carolyn, is an elementary 
school teacher. Dr. Ward comes to Muleshoe with the ‘highest’ qualifications for 
his position, and his wife, is equally qualified for hers. They are the parents of two 
children, a son, Kevin. Kevin is married to the former Kipi Fleming, of Friona. 
They are the parents of a daughter, Haylee Jalyn, 20 months old. Kevin is a 
Church of Christ minister at Walters, Okla. They are also the parents of a 
daughter, Karen, who is married to Getus Moore of Dalhart. They farm northeast 
of Dalhart, and are the parents of a son, Leland Dell, age two. The Wards enjoy 
building things. Mrs. Ward works in arts and crafts and stained glass; and Dr. 
Ward does metal or wood (he has his own welder, etc.). They have a small motor 
home which they have completely remodeled and use it frequently. For instance, 
they plan to spend three days canoeing the Rio Grand at Big Bend National Park 
during the Christmas holidays. They are members of the Muleshoe Church of 
Christ. “ We both love Muleshoe,” they said. “ We have found everyone to be just 
wonderful. The school has so many great people working in it. We are impressed 

11 and thrilled.”
.‘S» _____________________________

3 2 2  N. 1st
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jRebekah Lodge 
N ew s \

Creative Living
by Sheryl Borden

i
i

' Muleshoe Rebekah Lodge No. 
t 114 met Tuesday night, Dec. 6 in 

regular session . Lodge was 
opened by Noble Grand, Louise 

9 . Allen. Twenty one members 
: answered roll call. The flags were 
. presented by Sandi Robinson and 

Terie Snell. Minutes of the 
- previous meeting were read and 

approved and a treasurers report 
' was given by Ina Wilemon and 

approved.
“ Members who have been ill 

are all continuing to improve” 
t  said A dele Tompkins. “ We 

were especially glad to see some 
' members back who had not been 
:able to be with us for awhile.”

The Christmas party has been 
scheduled for Dec. 20 with gifts, 
fun and games. Everyone is ask 
to keep th*s in mind.

Adele Tompkins, Lodge De­
ft puty, gave instructions on voting 

and the qualifications needed to 
vote, after which elections were 
held. The following were elected 
to office, Audrey Langfitt, Noble 
Grand; Linda Tosh, vice grand; 
June Green, secretary; Adele 
Tompkins, treasurer; Pat Lang­
fitt, representative; Novella  
Price, alternate representative; 
and Sandi Robinson, team  
captain. These officers will be 
installed in January of 1989.

Happy bhthday was sung for 
Louise Allen and June Green 
follow ed by “ The Evening  
Prayer’ ’ and lodge was dismissed 
by Louise Allen.

v, Refreshments was served by 
Maud Young and One Berry.

The Muleshoe Branch ot the 
American Association of Un- 

For thickening gravy, sauce or stew, iversity Women met Monday 
aprinkle instant mashed potatoes evening in the home of Elizabeth 
Into the mix ant stir. Lumps dis- Watson for a Christmas dinner 

} solve im in ed iat^ j^  . l i a n  M HN —__

|  ^Deaii <3 fa e w fc .

£  you go 'v:: ptaije/ts. pa/ids, i/isite

and duAing my stay in die fosprarf.

^ U a y  Q od  ^ e s s  each you.

C 0eo and QVebb

GOLDEN WEDDING ANNIVERSARY-Mr. and Mrs. Jessie (J.V.) 
Stancell will be honored with a 50th wedding anniversary reception 
Sunday, Dec. 18 in the Muleshoe Church of Christ hosted by their 
children and family, Mr. and Mrs. Jackie Stancell of St. Louis, 
Missouri; Mr. and Mrs. Bennie Stancell of Muleshoe; and Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Taylor of Abilene. Mr. and Mrs. Stancell will greet their 
family and friends between the hours of 2 and 5 p.m. The couple 
were married on Dec. 23, 1938, in Clovis. N.M. They have lived and 
farmed all of their married lives in the West Camp community. They 
are members of the Lariat Church of Christ with Stancell being one of 
the charter members. The couple have 10 grandchildren.

Wofds Chkistms TXnncft, £vcfiange
and gift exchange. Margaret 
Gleason was co-hostess.

Following the meal, the group 
played seasonal games.

Justine Hanes, a Muleshoe 
High School senior, was chosen 
the AAUW Girl of the Month. 
She is the daughter of Dorothy 
and Frank Hanes.

Virginia Bowers, president, 
announced that the Muleshoe 
Branch won the grand prize for 
one division of the antique cars in 
the Muleshoe Christmas parade 
Saturday, Dec. 3. Howard 
Watson furnished the car and. 
AAUW mlembers did the decor­
ations.

M embers attending were: 
Virginia Bowers, Jean Allison, 
Ethel Allison, Joyeline Costen, 
Esther Marie Dillman, Maurine 
Hooten, Nan Johnson, Mary B. 
Obenhaus, Lucy Faye Smith and 
Elizabeth Watson.

Information on how to make 
beautiful appliqued sweatshirts 
simple Christmas crafts, ginger­
bread houses and carving the 
holiday turkey will be featured on 
“ Creative Living" on Tuesday, 
December 13 at 12 noon and 
repeated on Saturday, December 
17 at 2 p.m. on KENW-TV. (All 
times are Mountain.)

Kandy McWhorter is the 
Bailey County Extension Home 
Economist in Muleshoe, TX. 
Kandy will demonstrate how 
easy it is to make beautiful 
appliqued sweatshirts. With just 
a little imagination and some 
practice, you’ll be able to create 
your own version of the more 
expensive ready-made design.

Tracy Moxon is a home 
economics student at Eastern 
New Mexico University in Por- 
tales, and she will present 
several very simple Christmas 
crafts that you and the kids can 
enjoy working on together.

If you have always wished you 
could make a gingerbread house, 
you will enjoy the demonstration 
given by Stephanie West of 
Portales. Stephanie has created 
an entire gingerbread village and 
will share some of her tried and 
true techniques for making this 
fairyland creation.

Is carving the turkey always a 
chore to avoid at your house 
during the holidays? It doesn’t 
have to be this way. We have a 
chef with some expert advice who 
can show how it’s done perfectly 
every time.

On Tuesday, December 13 at 
9:30 p.m. and on Thursday, 
December 15 at 12 noon, the 
show will feature recipes for 
entertaining, dieting to lose 
weight, and attractive holiday 
decorations from a brown paper 
bag.

Dot Smith is the founder and 
president of Pepper Patch in 
Franklin, TN, and will share 
some of her favorite recipes for 
entertaining. Pepper Patch uses 
only the freshest homegrown 
ingredients and all the products 
art baked with homemade 
goodness.

As Americans become increas­
ingly weight conscious, more and 
more fad diets appear on the 
market. The trick to dieting is to

lose weight-and keep it o ff-  
without giving up all those 
tem pting foods. Dr. Martin 
Kathahn of Vanderbilt University 
will explain how this can be 
accomplished.

The flashback segment will 
feature New York artist, Eileen 
“ Butch” Krutchik. Butch is the 
self-proclaimed “ bag lady” and 
has coined the term “ bagri- 
culture” . She will make some 
attractive holiday decorations 
from a brown paper bag. Butch 
represents the American Faper 
Institute.

"Creative Living" is produced 
and hosted by Sheryl Borden. 
The show is carried on more than 
100 PBS stations in the United 
States, Canada, Guam and 
Puerto Rico and is distributed by 
Pacific Mountain Network, Den­
ver, CO. Viewers can request 
copies of printed m aterials 
offered on the show by calling on 
KENW-TV’s toll-free telephone 
lines between 8 a.m. and 5 p.m. 
In New Mexico, the number is 
1-800-432-2361, out-of-state: 1- 
800-545-2359 and Portales and 
Roosevelt County: 562-2112.

GINGERBREAD RECIPE 
Vi cup butter or margarine, 

softened; Vi cup brown sugar; Vi 
cup molasses; 3 Vi cups all-pur­
pose flour; 1 tsp. baking soda; 1 
tsp. cinnamon* Vs cup water; 1 
tsp. ginger; Vi tsp. salt; Vi tsp. 
cloves.

Cream butter and sugar 
thoroughly with electric mixer. 
Beat in molasses. Blend all dry 
ingredients. A lternately add 
blended dry ingredients and 
water to the butter-sugar mix­
ture. Dough will become very 
stiff so the last dry addition may

need to be blended by hand. 
Work dough until smooth in 
consistency. If dough sticks to 
hands, dust them with (tour. (Be 
careful and not use too much- 
flour as it will make dough dry 
and hard.) When dough is easy to 
work, you’re ready to roll it out 
and make house pieces. If you’re 
not going to make your house 
right away, wrap dough in plastic 
and refrigerate. R efrigerated  
dough will keep for a week, but 
remove it 3 hours prior to rolling 
so it softens and is pliable.

Roll out dough on back of 
cookie sheet. (Lightly coat cookie 
sheet with vegetable oil or Parr 
to facilitate rolling out dough.) 
Dust pattern with flour. Lay on 
dough and with sharp knife, cut 
around pattern. Remove excess 
dough by lifting it away from 
pattern pieces. Bake at 375 
degrees for 8-10 minutes. While 
pieces are still soft, place pattern 
pieces on top and trim edges to 
shape, if needed. Make at least 
48 hours before assembling.

ROYAL ICING: 
MARINGUE RECIPE 

(Used to assemble house, 
decorate and to attach decor­
ations. It dries very hard.)

3 level Tbsp. Wilton Meringue 
Powder Mix; 6 Tbsp. water; 4 
cups sifted powdered sugar.

Beat all ingredients at low 
speed for 7-10 minutes, (10-12 
minutes on High speed for 
portable mixer) until icing forms 
peaks. Can be stored in an 
air-tight container a.id re­
whipped before using. Yield: 3 
cups.

To give royal icing decoration a 
shiny snow-like effect, add 1 
tablespoon corn syrup to 1 cup 
royal icing.

Have You Heard This 
One?

Doctor— You have
acute appendicitis.

Wave—Listen, Dor. I 
came here to be examined,
no t arlmiroH

APPLICATIONS ON TUESDAY ONLY -  8:30 - 4:30
These jobs are offered by the Job Training Partnership Act par­
ticipating employers. Certain eligibility documentation will be 
required. Applications may be submitted and inquiries directed to 
J.T.P.A. department. Bailey County Community Action Center,

800 West American Blvd., Muleshoe, Texas 79347.

APPIICATIOINS ON TUESDAY ONLY - 8=30 - 4:30

Welcome To Muleshoe

James Crane Tire Co.
G O Q D f V E A R

2 7 2 -4 5 9 4

Deck Him Out For 
Christmas! «J

Mens Western Suits

69"
Reg. 129" See our Full Corral 
of 2 and 3 pc. Western Suits 
in a variety of colors, ranging 
from Med. and Dark Browns, 
Greys to Dark Blues, and some 
just too pretty to describe.

Sizes 36 to 46 
Regs. & Longs

F o r  T h e  B ig  M a n  
Dressy Western Shirts

16"
In extra sizes, solids, stripes 
& plaids. Sizes i5H-34 to 
18-35. Val. to 21."

Henry Insurance 
Agency

111 W. Ave. B.

Damron Rexall
Drug

2 7 2 -4 2 1 03 0 8  Main2 72-4581

18960649
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Muleshoe...
Cont. from Page 1 . 
donating canned food, but more 
can be used by the EMS to 
deliver on Christmas Eve Day.

Call Bailey County EMS at 
272-4390 for additional informa­
tion.

The MISD board of trustees 
will meet Monday, December 12, 
at 7:30 p.m. at the school 
administration office in regular

session.
After formal opening of the 

meeting, financial reports will be 
given, as well as the following 
business items:

Discuss school priority list and 
take appropriate action; discuss 
TEA letter concerning approved 
extra-curricular activities and 
take appropriate action; discuss 
school bus purchase and take 
appropriate action.

After the tax collection report, 
special reports will be given.

Aging,

ITe,
s

THREE WAY NATIONAL HONOR SOCIETY -tour new members were inducted into the National 
Honor Society at the Three Way School recently. They joined the other NHS students in the school. 
Pictured from left are Sheila Tucker, Melinda Turney, Norma Rubalcava, Carrie Kindle, Jarrod Sowder, 
Ernesto Rubalcava and Chris Locke. (Guest Photo)

3-Way School Inducts New NHS Members
Four students from Three Way 

High School were inducted into 
the membership of the National 
Honor Society in a ceremony at 
the high school on November 22. 
These four members were 
selected by a faculty council for 
m eeting high standards of 
scholarshig^se^^

and character.
The new inductees are Carrie 

Kindle, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jam es Kindle; Norma 
Rubalcava, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ie o  Rubalcava; Chris 
Locke, son of Joanne Cotton and 
Ferris Locke; and Ernesto Rubal­
cava.

This Christmas give
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These four students join the 
present NHS members Jarrod 
Sowder, Sheila Tucker, and 
Melinda Turney in forming the 
1988-89 Three Way Chapter of 
the National Honor Society.

The National Honor Society 
ranks as one of the oldest and 
most prestigious national organi­
zations for high school students.

Chapters exist in three-fourths 
of the nations’ high schools and, 
since 1921, more than six million 
students have been selected to 
membership.

More than two million dollars 
in scholarships have been award­
ed tc senior members since 1945 
by the sponsoring organization, 
the National Association of Sec­
ondary School Principals.

NOTICE
“ Advertisers should check their 
ad the first day of insertion. The 
Journals will not be liable for 
failure to publish an ad or for 
typographical error or errordlid 
publication except to the extent 
of the cost of the ad for the first 
day insertion.. Adjustment for 
errors will be limited to the cost 
of that portion of the ad where 
the error occurred.”

health care.
“ Veterans and their families 

naturally have a lot of questions 
about these things. Twelve mil­
lion men came back from World 
War II alone. That doesn’t 
include veterans from the Korean 
and Vietnam Wars, whom we 
also help,” Williams says.

The Bailey County Aging and 
Health Care office offers Meals 
on Wheels and a van transpor­
tation service, both of which are 
very important to the elderly in 
the community.

Meals on Wheels offers those 
who qualify one hot, nutritious 
.meal delivered at noon every day 
by volunteers. Currently, the 
program serves 25 people in the 
Muleshoe area, and an indivi­
dual’s income has no bearing on 
qualifying for the program. To be 
eligible, you need only be 60 
years of age or older and unable 
to prepare adequate meals, or 
have someone do it for you. For 
married couples, if one person 
qualifies, that automatically qua­
lifies their spouse for Meals on 
Wheels.

The Office of Aging also offers 
a van transportation service tht 
takes people who are unable to 
drive themselves, to places they 
need to go. The service will only 
to to places that service a 
particular need of a passenger, 
such as a doctor’s office, 
hospital, post office, barber, or 
grocery store. It will not take 
people for tours or shopping 
trips. The van goes to Lubbock, 
Amherst, Amarillo and occasion­
ally Plain view, making close to 
100 trips a month, and logging 
between 20,000-2$,000 miles per

Williims haaia lot"of^exper­
ience which lends to his expertise 
in the many areas he’s involved 
in. He has farmed, raised 
livestock and sold insurance,

And Health
Cont. from Page 1

along with serving on the 
Muleshoe school board and the 
board of trustees in Plain view. 
He has been county commission­
er, county judge, and served for 
many years in the criminal justice 
division.

Williams’ office is located on 
the first floor of the Bailey 
Cour ty courthouse, and his office 
number there is 272-3647. 
Williams says he is mere than 
willing to answer any questions 
on the services he and his office 
are able to provide.

Weather.*
Cont. from Page 1 ^
percent chance of more snow, 
with little additional accumula­
tion.

To the south, freezing rain was 
predicted from the upper-level 
storm that was moving out of 
northern Mexico into the area.

NWS said a warming trend 
would move into the area, with§ 
warmer, more seasonal tempera­
tures through Wednesday.

Afternoon temperatures by 
Wednesday are expected to read 
in the upper 50’s by mid-week.

Clovis, 30 miles to the west of 
Muleshoe, received more than 
six inches of snow Wednesday 
night and Thursday, and to th eg  
east of M uleshoe, Lubbock 
received two-three inches.

Army to Shield Choppers 
The Army, alarmed by 

test results showing that 
radio waves can shut down 
the vital hydraulic system of 
its Black Hawk helicopter, 
will shielf the system's elec­
tronic controls from such % 
interference, officials said.
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SHADES OF THE WILD WESTf-lt was parade time in Muleshoe,
and one of the entries in the annual Christmas Parade was the buffalo 
from West Texas State University, Canyon. The strong young 
gentlemen guiding the buffalo were attached by heavy lines to a 
harness on the buffalo. He? She: It? was enjoyed by everyone who 
watched the parade. (Journal Photo)

not only took the ladies from the 
beauty shop but all our ladies and 
men.

• • •
Jackie Johnson and son, 

Nicholas, Mabel Caldwell visited 
the nursing home Wednesday.

Nursing Home 
News

By: Joy Stance!!

isThe Spirit of Christmas 
flowing through the nursing 
home and is flourishing. We are 
blessed.

• • •
Thursday morning Clara L. 

Jones came to play the piano for 
our Devotional and participate in 
the exercise class.

Thursday afternoon Ollie Se- 
bring, Winnie Berry and J.E. 
Embry came to play table games 
with the residents.

Wednesday afternoon Glenda 
Jennings came for our weekly 
Sing-a-long.

***
Clifton Finley came to go 

shopping for the residents and 
nursing home.

**•
Friday Harold and Avis Car­

penter from the Oklahoma Lane 
Community came to visit and 
entertain and direct us ,in *»"',
Sing-a-long. •

•**
Saturday the residents watch­

ed the Christmas parade as it 
passed by the nursing home.

• • •
Allie Barbour was visited by 

Mabel Caldwell and son, Pinkie 
Barbour, Wednesday.

Lois Ethridge was visited by 
Clara L. Jones and Peggy 
Buhrman this week.

**•
Effie Smith, Pearl Cox and 

Thelma Steams and Dustie were 
a big help in decorating the 
Christmas tree Friday.

PRINCIPAL’S "A”
HONOP ROLL

FIRST GRADE
Mayra Hernandez, Scotti 

Brown, Jason Jesko, Garrett 
Magby and Veronica Mata. 

SECOND GRADE-McADAMS 
Seth Black, Holly Engelking, 

Cade Morris and Amber Richard­
son.

SECOND GRADE-FURR 
Becky Cantu, Deanne Gark, 

Dene’ Gark, Ysela Cuevas, 
Jacoby JennLigs, Joshua Mc­
Donald, Rosie Mendoza, Josh 
Morris, Kia Morris and Shena 
Seaton.

THIRD GRADE 
Brice Foster, Shelbi Robinson 

and Dustin Weir.
FOURTH GRADE 

Shana Foster, Mandy Magby 
and Blake Mimms.

FIFTH GRADE
Travis Barber, Heather Engel­

king, Julie McDonald, Socorro 
Reyes and Dawn Weir.

“ A-B” HONOR ROLL

FIRST GRADE
Staci Foster, Tyler Gartin, 

Tony Gutierrez, Zulema Mar­
quez, Bobby Martha and Caro­
lina Rivera.

SECOND GRADE-McADAMS 
Kellie Gutierrez, Brandon Fos­

ter, Andy Johnson, Christina 
Martha Erika Rivera and Johnny 
Willingham.

SECOND GRADE-FURR 
Eddie Joe H odges, Jose

Marquez, Jose Mendoza and 
Adam St. Clair.

THIRD GRADE 
Don Burch, Deon Gallman, 

Carla Johnson, Juan Salazar and 
Jason Thomas.

FOURTH GRADE 
Heath Brown, Edward Terry, 

Angie Willingham.
FIFTH GRADE

Keith Burch, Josie Cortez, 
Sammy Everett, Marisol Godin­
ez, Katy Jor.es, Jr. Lopez, Guy 
Nickels, Krista Smith and Veron­
ica De La Fuente.

Christmas note: Re­
member that several 
hundred Christmas trees 
catch fire each year.

The
Perfect Gift

Despite what many 
people say, tne younger 
generation is not worthless.

atients In 
West Plains

Medical Center
DEC. 5-8

MONDAY, DEC.5 
Verbie Griffith and Libiado 
Olivarez

TUESDAY, DEC. 6 
Verbie Griffith

WEDNESDAY, DEC. 7 
Dena Garcia, Gloria Smith, 
Verbie Griffith, Donald Harrison 
and Jerrcll Otwell

THURSDAY, DEC. 8 
Dena Garcia, Verbie Griffith, 
Donald Harrison, Roger Vaega, 
L.C. Malone and Jerrell Otwell

Money?
A newspaper offered a 

prize for the best definition 
of money. The following 
entry won: Money is an ar­
ticle which may be used as a 
universal passport to every­
thing except heaven and as a 
universal provider of any­
thing except happiness.

25
YEARS
FESTIVE POODS
COOKBOOK
Give the gift that keeps on giving, meal 

after meal. . .  25 Years of Festive Foods 
Cookbook from SPS. This anniversary 
cookbook compiles over 2,000 taste- 
tested recipes which SPS home econo­
mists have shared in demonstrations 
with our customers over the past 25 
years. You’ll find everything from “appe­
tizers” to “odds n ends” in this color­
fully illustrated, three-ring, hati-bound 
book. The perfect gift for those hard-to- 
buy-for people on vour Christmas list 
. . .  yourself, included!

Order your copy today! Quantities limited.

ONLY *12.75 plus tax .

Available at any SPS office or order by mail:

NAME

ADDRESS

CITY STATE ZIP

NO. of COOKBOOKS TOTAL*

* For each cookbook, please include $12.75 plus $3.00 shipping and handling and 
applicable sales tax: TX - $1.10; NM • $.93: OK - $.95; KS - $.71.

Make check or money order payable to Southwestern Public 
Service Company. Mail to:

Southwestern Public Service Company
SPS) P. O. Box 9422 • Amarillo, TX 79105-9422

Saturday J.C. Shanks came to 
shave the men and give them 
hair cuts.

*•*
Our thanks to the Mary Martha 

Sunday School Gass for their 
donation to our activity fund.

Juanita Snow was v isited  
Sunday by her sister, Vida Cash 
of Hereford, her sister, Marieta 
Courme of Bula, Ona Michelle 
Snell of Weatherford, Tex., 
Robin Kathleen of Muleshoe, 
Linda Jones of Muleshoe.

g  Inez Allgood was presented a 
special mug from Ollie Sebring 
on their visit Friday.

Clara Weaver’s daughters, Pat 
and Linda were in Muleshoe 
visiting with Clara over the 
weekend.

•**
Connor Burford was visited by 

^ Joe Smallwood and his wife, 
Willie Burford. He received a 
special plate of goodies from 
Sudan.

**•
Roy Taylor had visitors Tues­

day from Earth who brought him 
a plate of Christmas treats.

•**
Sunday morning the Muleshoe 

Church of Christ brought com­
munion.

Kathrine Sanders taught the 
, Bible Study and visited.

Sunday afternoon the Calvary 
B aptist Church presented a 
special Christmas cantata.l It was
a beautiful presentation.

•  **#
Monday evening a Muleshoe 

4-H group came carolling down 
the halls and stopped and sang 
out side of the dining room as the 
resid en ts were having their 
evening meal.

***
Tuesday afternoon Lula Maye 

if Shanks, Beth Watson, Olive Cox, 
and Freida Locker came to 
shampoo and set the ladies hair 
as they left the beauty shop they 
went to the day room where 
Rhonda Carpenter, our photo­
grapher, took their pictures 
beside the Christmas tree. She

To Come By And Visit And Have

Refreshments.

(Be Sure To Bring l l ie  Wives)

Clays Corner- Muleshoe- Enochs

K
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Plains Heating & Air Conditioning
9. Heat Pump Specialists
r‘ Total Service! That’s what you get when PLAINS HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING is on the job. 

This experienced firm specializes in heating and air conditioning and can handle the entire project 
from start to finish! PLAINS HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING located in Littlefield, phone 
385-3715, is one company that’s capable of complete installations of both your heating and tooling 
systems. They also specialize in all repair work on your heating and cooling units. Their teams of 
skilled experts stand ready to assist you in every possible way. The Writers of this Review suggest 
you contact this full service firm for all your heating and air conditioning needs. They wish all a 
‘VERY JOYOUS HOLIDAY AND BRIGHT NEW YEAR!”

South Plains Hospital - Clinic
SOUTH PLAINS HOSPITAL - CLINIC is known throughout this section as a place where expert 
medical attention can be had. When you or any member of your family needs medical care you want 
to be sure you .nre getting the best. SOUTH PLAINS HOSPITAL-CLINIC takes grof.t pride in their 
staff of physicians and they may be credited with helping many regain bettc. health. These 
physicians have at their disposal the latest in equipment and laboratory facilities which enables 
them to diagnose and treat illnesses properly. We take this opportunity to recommend SOUTH 

\  PLAINS HOSPITAL-CLINIC, at 1400 Main in Amherst, phone 246-3536, to all our readers in this 
area. No more public spirited citizens could be found anywhere than the members of the 
Administration and Staff of this fine hospital-clinic. They wish all “A JOYOUS CHRISTMAS A 
HOLIDAY SEASON.”

Mechanical Techniques
Ricky Klein - owner¥ %

l Where does the smart truck driver take his rig for service in our area? MECHANICAL
* TECHNIQUES has been repairing and maintaining trucks for years and the men who know quality
: keep coming back again and again! Located at 1101 West 1st, W. Hwy 60 in Hereford, phone
* 364-7714, this outstanding service depot caters to the needs of the professional driver with
* lubrication, tune-ups, general welding, rear ends, transmissions and most any other repair needed.
» They are the acknowledged experts in the field! These skilled technicians know that down time costs
* you money, and they make every effort to get you rolling again in a minimum of time. Whether it’s 

Kenworth, GMC, Peterbuilt, Mack, White or any other brand. Don’t let just anyone service your

!
* truck...See the experts and drive away with a perfectly repaired rig! We recommend them and 

suggest you become a regular customer. They wish a “JOYOUS HOLIDAY SEASON!. ” to all our 
readers.

D.L.'s Thriftway
D.L. & Ruth Harguess - owners

D.L.’S THRIFTWAY located at 1105 Hwy. 60 West in Friona, phone 247-3913, can save you money 
on food costs and give you quality food products in exchange. They have a choice selection of 
government inspected and graded meat assuring you a high quality eating at a reasonable cost. 
Coffee and popular brand canned goods are featured here, giving you a variety of dishes for any 
meal. Fresh shipments of fruit insure you of a delicious salad or desert. D.L.’S THRIFTWAY 
specialize in a wide selection of fresh fruits, vegetables, as well as frozen foods, delightful the year 
around. You can shop at D.L.’S THRIFT WAY in Friona where fresh quality foods are coupled with 
cheerful service to make your grocery shopping a pleasure, not a chore. Become a regular customer 
and count your savings! D.L., Ruth & employees wish all * ‘A MERRY CHRISTMAS!” Open 
Mon.-Sat., 8 a.m .-8 p.m. and Sun., noon-6 p.m..

Friona Transport
Feed 41 Grain Hauling

To receive the best service and results in shipping your goods it is generally accepted that it pays to 
«; do business with FRIONA TRANSPORT. This reliable trucking concern has served the farmers and 
\  ranchers of this district most efficiently and always with a remarkable degree of satisfaction and 
; that they have been successful is evidenced by the increasing number of people who are doing 

business with this firm. They offer both local and long distant hauling. FRIONA TRANSPORT 
located in Friona on E. Hwy. 60, phone 247-2724, is a progressive organization, having gained the 
confidence of the people throughout this section. We suggest to farmers and ranchers of this section 
that they contact FRIONA TRANSPORT for fast, dependable hauling. Call day or night. They wish 
everyone a HAPPY HOUDAY SEASON A BRIGHT NEW YEAR!”American Fructose Dimmitt, Inc.

AMERICAN FRUCTOSE is located at 700 E. Jones St., in Dimmitt, phone 647-4141. One of the 
most important things for a poultry of livestock grower to consider is the nutritive value of the feeds 

< they are using. The folks at AMERICAN FRUCTOSE realize this fact and have invested a vast sum 
V of money on equipment and research to produce these high quality products. They offer: CORN 
\  WET-MILLED FEED PRODUCTS-HIGH MOISTURE CORN BRAN-60% PROTEIN GLUETEN
• MEAL-CORN MEAL and LIQUID CORN SOLUBLES. A good source for natural protein. They are 
» happy to advise their customers as to the proper feeding of any kind of stock. Since this is a broad

field of study, many have taken advantage of the friendly service which they offer. We would like to 
: recommend the friendly folks at AMERICAN FRUCTOSE to all our readers. The manager &
; employees wish all “A MERRY CHRISTMAS A A HAPPY A PROSPEROUS 1989. ”

Harrell Building Supply Inc.
HWI Dealer

HARRELL BUILDING SUPPLY with 2 locations to serve you in Anton at 200 Lawrence Ave., phone 
997-3621 or 997-5051 (Mon.-Wed.-Fri. 8 a.m.-5 p.m., Tue.-Thurs. 8 a,m.-7 p.m. & Sat. 8 a.m.-l 
p.m.) in Levelland on Hwy. 114 phone 894-5366 (Mon.-Sat. 8 a.m.-5 p.m.) has a complete line of 
builders supplies and lumber in stock at all times. In any season of the year, you can buy here with 
confidence. Above all, a firm must give the people what they want, when they want it. This is the 
reputation they have built in this area. They are providing for the public, the best in building 
materials at the most reasonable cost. Here you can obtain quality lumber, paint, builders 
hardware, plywood, carpenters tools, siding, roofing materials and more. Take your building 
problem to them and they will be more than happy to help you in any way that they can. We 
congratulate them for the reputation they have built serving the public. They extend to all a “VERY 
MERRY CHRISTMAS A JOYOUS NEW YEAR”! ■

Excel Corporation
• E X C E L  CORPORATION located 4 miles W. of Friona on Hwy. 60, phone 295-3201, are distributors 
i of high-grade meats and allied meat products and are enjoying an ever increasing patronage from 
« this part of the state. Because of the great volume of business transacted through their extensive 
> wholesale establishment and because of their up-to-date business methods and high-quality
• products EXCEL CORPORATION has gained for this city a commercial prestige as an excellent 

market for retailers that could be gained in no other manner. Their meat packers work under the 
most sanitary conditions. They are USDA inspected and approved. We, in this Review, wish to 
compliment them on the valuable service they are rendering their community. The manager k. 
employees wish all ”A HAPPY HOLIDAY SEASON. ”

Paco Feed Yard
PACO FEED YARD is located in Hub, phone 265-3281. This FEED LOT specializes in custom cattle 
feeding the year around and boasts a capacity for feeding 32,000 head of cattle. Their reputation has 
been built through reliable service. They feature all modern feed lots and experienced hands w o 
are more than qualified to handle your stock. They feed only the best feed that can be had, to insure 
you of MORE WEIGHT on your beef in the shortest period of time. Farmers and ranchers have seen 
using the service rendered at this lot with the greatest satisfaction, knowing they can rely on this 
feed lot to fatten their beef for market year after year. We in this Review are happy to recommend 
this feed lot to all our readers who want to get the most from their cattle investment. The manager 
employees wish “ALL A MERRY CHRISTMAS A A PROSPEROUS NEW YEAR! ”

Friona Farmers Co-op Gin
It’s Your Gin - Use It

FRIONA FARMERS CO-OP GIN on Hwy. 214 S. in Friona, phone 265-3398, has served the farmers 
of our area faithfully and honestly for years. This fine co-op gin is capably operated, placing the 
welfare of the customer above all else. Honest, weights, efficient handling, and modern methods 
combine to result in the best and fastest service for the cotton producer The ginning of our cotton 
can best be handled by this experienced firm. Through their expert service to the cotton industry, 
your profits will grow. We commend the management of this excellent co-op gin for their great 
contribution to the cotton industry and for maintaining stabilized prices for the benefits of the cotton 
producer. They wish everyone a “HAPPY HOUDAY SEASON” A SINCERELY Thank you for your 
business!

Juanito's Restaurant
JUANITO’S RESTAURANT located at 1608 Mabry Dr. in Clovis, phone 505-762-7822, is noted 
throughout this area for a fine selection of delicious Mexican dishes. They feature the best in Tacos, 
Enchiladas, Tamales, Chalupas, Chile Rellonos, Burritos, Combo Plates, Giant Sopapillas and much 
more. The Mexican decor and atmosphere of this fine restaurant will put you in just the right mood 
for a dish with the “ South of the Border” flavor. Service and good food are assured you at this 
excellent dining establishment. We commend the management upon the supremacy presented the 
public here, and suggest that all our readers visit JUANITO’S regularly. Take your family, your 
friends, or business acquaintances to this fine restaurant for a real treat! JUAN and NOEMI 
GARZA and staff wish all “A VERY HAPPY HOUDAY SEASON. ” Open Tues.-Sat., 11 a.m.-9 
p.m. 8c Sun. 11 a.m.-2 p.m.

JR Plumbing Heating & Air Conditioning
JR PLUMBING HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING is located at 409 W. 11th in Friona, phone 
247-8020. Superior to the vast majority of plumbing, heating and air conditioning shops and 
unsurpassed by none, either in general excellence of work or superiority of materials used. This 
popular firm has continued its successful career for many years because the management and 
assistants are among the most efficient plumbing, heating and air conditioning craftsmen in this 
part of the state. If you are figuring on any work, let them help you make up your plans. You will 
find that your consultation there will save you money. They have gained the excellent reputation for 
giving prompt and courteous attention to every job. In this Review, we are glad to compliment them 
and to refer them to all our readers when desiring work or information in this line. They wish 
everyone a “JOYOUS CHRISTMAS!”

North Plains Mall
That friendly shopping area at 2809 N. Prince in Clovis, phone 505-769-2308, is just waiting for you 
with bargains galore and some real old fashion service! We’re talking about NORTH PLAINS MALL 
and its high time that you made this fine shopping center a regular stop on your shopping 
excursions. Featuring a complete line of quality clothing, gifts, household items and fine eating 
establishments. These well known merchants offer some great buys on all types of goods. They also 
specialize in service with a capitol S! Stop in soon and see what we mean! NORTH PLAINS MALL 
includes some of the regions most prominent firms. Their business policies and courteous personnel 
have won them the respect and patronage throughout the area. We highly recommend NORTH 
PLAINS MALL in Clovis. They take this opportunity to wish “HAPPYHOLIDAYS” to all!

ASCOM
In this Review - We salute ASCOM in Plainview at 3422 Olton Rd., phone 293-3626 in Clovis at 116 
East Grand, phone 505-763-5520. They offer: car phones, pocket pagers and complete two-way 
engineering...design, installation sales and service. They offer mobile telephone service to the 
Muleshoe area. In this particular field there is no company more worthy of extended mention. 
ASCOM is under the direction of men thoroughly versed in every feature of communications and it 
has grown to be one of the most important industrial assets to the area. They are known for prompt 
service, fair prices and standing behind every job. This firm’s management has had wide 
experience in every feature of this business and because of their comprehensive knowledge, they 
have continued to witness the increase in the number of their patrons. We commend the 
management, on being such an asset to this area and suggest you call ASCOM for your 
communications needs. They wish all a “JOYOUS CHRISTMAS A HAPPY 1989!”

Bryant Sales And Service
Air Conditioning-Heating-Plumbing-Motors-Fixtures

Refrigeration Service
Long recognized as “ THE BEST MAN FOR THE JOB,” BRYANT SALES & SERVICE has been 
serving the elctrical needs of this area with skill, dedication and integrity for many years! Located at 
121 S.E. 3rd in Dimmitt, phone 647-3149 (nights 647-5509). BRYANT SALES AND SERVICE, 
qualified electrical contractors is fully experienced in residential, commercial and industrial 
installations and repairs. No wonder leading businesses and factories in the area contact BRYANT 
SALES AND SERVICE, FIRST when they need the best in electrical work! Marvin Bryant - owner & 
employees wish all “A MERRY CHRISTMAS A A HAPPY NEW YEAR. ”

Fieldton Butane & Fertilizer
Residents throughout the area will be pleased to know that FIELDTON BUTANE & FERTILIZER, is 
the distributor of L.P. gas in both bottled and bulk form. This friendly concern specializes in 
personalized service and regular deliveries to all outlying areas. You won’t be without the clean 
warmth of gas with this firm on the job. Located in Fieldton, phone 262-4303. They realize the 
importance of keeping the customer satisfied. Whether you’re a small or large user of L.P. Gas, 
FIELDTON BUTANE will do their utmost to keep you satisfied. They value their customers above 
all else and their record of dependability shows it. Give them a call anytime! They also feature 
fertilizers-dry-liquid-ammonia-chemical & equipment sales - pumps sales and repair. They 
extend to all a “MERRY CHRISTMAS A PROSPEROUS NEW YEAR ”!

David's Discount Drug
David Finke R Ph Regina Finke-R.Ph.

One of the area’s leading prescription pharmacies is DAVID’S DISCOUNT DRUG located at 506 8th 
St. in Olton, phone 285-2398, on call for emergency prescriptions 24 hours a day, 7 days a week 
phone 285-3314, (answering service available). This well-known drug store features everything to 
help you feel better. You should, of course, see your family doctor whenever you have any type of 
health problems, but you should come to this respected pharmacy for ALL of your prescriptions and 
medicines. DAVID’S DISCOUNT DRUG also carries a complete line of gifts as well as other items 
which are indispensable for modern living. There are health and beauty aids, candies, photo 
processing, housewares, cards and stationary and much, much more. You’ll enjoy shopping at this 
fine drug store, and they won’t let you down where service is concerned. The write.*s of this Review 
suggest that all of readers shop; where service and selection go hand in hand...at DAVID’S 
DISCOUNT DRUG in Olton. They will gladly mail prescriptions at no additional cost Thev wi«h >u 
“ VERY MERRY CHRISTMAS A HAPPY NEW YEAR!” Open 8:30 - 5:30 Mon.-Fri.- Sat 8:30 
a.m.-1:00 p.m.

♦
k

»

\

t

t

t



Bailey County Journal, M leshoe, Texas, Sunday, December i l ,  1988, Page 9

here‘i
H i e

ram

H u n tin g !

For ChristmaM Gift Now Whole Strip
Cut & Wrapped to your 
specifications

Cut & ■  lb.
Wrapped to your specifications, by the steak

I^arry’s
Bone-In Sugar Cured 

Hickory SMoked
m  Ham

Boneless Ham 
^  Smoked

Beef Jerky 1 Lw,‘ «...«»
w  J  packages of Jerky in stock.

Pheasant Hunter’s Snack .̂ 5|
■ . «■ . -

It would also make a mighty fine stocking stuffer.

Deadline For Booking Your Bone-In Hams
is December 14th /

Deadline For Smoking Christmas 
Turkeys Is December 21st

I jet Vs Do Your Custom Processing
272-4703

Sudan Sen's
alt-
a by Evelyn Ritchie

•* *

The junior high Hornettes win 
bifi 42-8 over Three-Way recently 
whiin Jill Reid placed the locals 
with 4 field goals for 8 points. 
The hornettes took a whopping 
lead 10-2 in the opening stanza 
and with no problems, cruised on 
for a big win.

Joey Martin tossed in 3 & 1 for 
5, JR.R. Gun tossed in 3 fg for 6; 
C. Weaver 2 fg for 4; T. Williams 
and E. Martinez each tossed in a 
field goal for 2 points each; A. 
Martinelz chipped in a free one 
and M. Richard and R. Childers 
ea^h hit 2&1 for 5.

The junior varisity Hornettes 
had a 38-18 win over Hale Center 
last week when Mandy Carr led

with 4&4 for 12; Amy Adams 
contributed 5 field goals for 10 . 
Kay Lynn Gordon sank 2&2 plus 
a 3 pointer for 7 and Suzanne 
Reid hit 3 fg for 6 with Melanie 
McKillip tossing in 3 from the 
line.

The girls took an 8-1 lead in the 
first and had a 13-7 lead at half 
time. They came back and added 
12&13 while Hale Center added 
5&6.

***

The varsity Hornettes won 
66-38 over Hale Center recently 
when Teena Newman placed the 
Hornettes with 8 field goals and 
5-7 free ones for 21; K. Hargrove 
hit 5&3 for 15 and Kendra and 
Tonya Fisher hit 4 fg for 8 each. 
N. Maxfield tossed in 3&2 for 8 
and Star Tennyson and Melanie 
Peck also saw action. The 
Hornettes took a lead 19-13 in the 
first stanza of play and had built 
up a 34-22 half time lead. Teena 
took the shooting lead in the 3rd 
play period by tossing in 3 field

goals and 2 free ones and 
Maxfield tossed in one field goal 
and 2 free ones for 4. Fisher and 
K. Hargrove each contributed 2 
for another 16 for the Hornettes. 
The locals added another 16 in 
the final period for the win.

• • •

In the first win of the 
Thanksgiving tournament held in 
Wichita Falls the Hornettes faced 
Burkburnett and won 58-24. 
Tenna Newman hit 6&3 for 15; 
K.Hargrove and N. Maxfield 5 
for 10 each; K. Fisher 4&1 for 9; 
T. Fisher 3&2 for 8 and S. 
Williams 2 for 4 and T.Williams 
one fg for 2. Also seeing action 
were S. Tennyson and Melanie 
Peck.

Dorman Chester has been 
released following surgery last 
week and is recuperating at home 
and is doing very well.

***

Linda Wiseman of ACU and 
Mr. and Mrs. Randy Wiseman of

TOWN a COUNTRY REVIEW
*», ■> rjy "ffi ;** * •- v '* ■ * Vi, ' k Jh
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Plains Convalescent Center
-Vickie Hutton Administrator

Heritage Home
- Lee Hawkins Administrator

Residents of this area can find the best care for those they care for the most when they learn first 
hand of the extensive facilities at PLAINS CONVALESCENT CENTER in Plainview at 2813 W. 8th, 
phone 293-2581 and HERITAGE HOME in Plainview at 2510 W. 24th, phone 296-5584. For care 
beyond compare your choice should be one of these outstanding facilities. Their patients care is 
their first concern. They have a well trained staff, room well furnished, bed patients receive special 
attention and care, tasty and nutritious food..including special diets and 24 hour nursing care. 
These are just a part of the services featured here where they add years to senior citizens lives, and 
LIFE TO THEIR YEARS. Programmed activities available for those able and desirous of 
participating. Vickie, Lee and their staff wish all "A JOYOUS HOLIDAY SEASON AND HEALTHY 
NEW YEAR!"

Sherley-Anderson Grain Co.
In this Review - we salute SHE^LEY-ANDERSOff GRAIN £ 0 ., iyho operate*a grain elevator with a 
total capacity of 6 million bushels, located in Lariat, phone 825-2565. No Review of this area would 
be complete without prominent mention of this well known grain elevator which adds to the 
progress of the community as well as the general welfare of our citizens. This elevator is individually 
operated and its benefits are appreciated by all who trade with them. It is important that we have 
conscientious firms like this. We wish to compliment this excellent organization upon the way in 
which this business is operated and salute them for their progressive and public-spirited policies. 
They wish all a "JOYOUS CHRISTMAS & BRIGHT 1989!"
d i '

i Roosevelt General Nursing Home
Americans are not just living longer, they are living more useful, productive lives. But an increasing 
number of the aged and convalescent, need some place other than the hospital and home where they 
cart receive personal care, 24 hour attention, and the opportunity to continue to live their lives with 
meaning. As a leading HEALTH CARE FACILITY, ROOSEVELT GENERAL NURSING HOME 
located at 1700 S. Ave. O in Portales, wants to help you make the right decision. These are some 
guidelines: See your physician to determine the kind of care needed, visit this facility, ask about 
costs, and financial advice about Medicare and Medicaid, examine the facilities, check the food 
quality, and safety features, and finally, observe how the residents spend their time. There’s a lot 
more to selecting the right nursing home. ROOSEVELT GENERAL NURSING HOME wants to 
help. If you have any questions phone 505-356-4411 or visit soon. They wish all a "JOYOUS 
CHRISTMAS & HEALTHY NEW YEAR! "

Frontier Hybrids
FRONTIER HYBRIDS is located at 413 S. Ave. D. in Abernathy, phone 298-2595 or 1-800-872-0522. 
No one is better acquainted with the seed business than FRONTIER HYBRIDS. Their many years of 
experience in the seed business have enabled them to offer you seed that will produce and that will 
give you the highest yield for the variety. They feature Grass Seed for CRP (custom blending at no 
extra charge) Blue Grama, Bluestems, Buffalograss, Lovegrasses, Switchgrass, Side-Oats, Hybrid 
Grain Sorghum & Com, Hybrid Sorghum X Sudan Cross and custom seed cleaning. FRONTIER 
HYBRIDS continually studies the results of planting of various brands in various soils, therefore 
planters in this section may seek their advice. The progressive planter realized that to do business 
with the local merchant means economy and better planting results. We recommend FRONTIER 
HYBRIDS to all our readers for anything in the field or seed lines, garden and yard supplies. 
FRONTIER HYBRIDS wish everyone a "HAPPYHOLIDAY SEASON" & SINCERELY thanks you 
for your business. -

Struve Implement
STRUVE IMPLEMENT located at Hwy. 54 North of Abernathy, phone 298-2507, is your authorized 
dealer for CASE-INTERNATIONAL HARVESTER FARM MACHINERY and TRACTORS. These 
machines are well known in this area for their durability and have been proven to be most 
satisfactory in every way to the people that have used them. With an ever increasing cost of 
operating a farm or ranch, one must do everything he can to keep costs down. One way to make sure 
is to do business with a machinery dealer that not only offers quality products but the finest service 
and this is the one. They feature a complete parts and repair department so that when your 
equipment needs service or repair, they can give you the service you need, in the shortest time and 
at the least possible cost to you. They wish everyone a "MERRY CHRISTMAS A BRIGHT 1989."

Travel Center H V H H H j
Bill & Dorie Brummund-owners

Let TRAVEL CENTER in Clovis arrange all details for your trip at no extra cost to you. They are 
located at 121 W. 7th and are agents for domestic and international airlines. AMTRAK, tours and 
cruises. Phone 505-762-4566 and tell this excellent travel service where you wish to go. They have 
all schedules and travel information at their fingertips, as they are “ computerized” and will provide 
tickets for you with all arrangements made at NO additional cost. We are fortunate to have this 
valued travel service in our area and compliment the management for presenting such a truly 
outstanding service. This fine service is your guarantee of the best in accommodations, connections 
and services. Bill & Dorie Brummund are Certified Travel Consultants-receiving a 3 year degree at 
the INSTITUTE OF C.T.A. in Wellesley. Mass. They wish ail a "JOYOUS HOLIDAY SEASON!"

Lubbock visited during the 
“holidays with their parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Pudd Wiseman.

i  • • •
Martha Drake of Austin visited 

during the Thanksgiving holidays 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Withrow, and sisters, Mr. 

* and Mrs. Greg Lance and Megan 
and Mr. and Mrs. John Corley, 
Stacey and Micha.

»
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Haynie 

visited their daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. David Budsida in Hobbs, 
N.M. during the Thanksgiving 
holidays.

* * •

Josephine Fisher and Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Fisher and Shannon 
spent the Thanksgiving holidays 
in Wichita Falls when the Sudan 
Hornettes played in the TBA 
Thanksgiving tournament there 
and Tanya is a member of the 
team.

***

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Summer 
spent the Thanksgiving holidays 
in San Diego visiting friends and 
relatives.

***

Mr. and Mrs. Kevin Pickrell 
and Mr. and Mrs. Jason Bell all 
of Lubbock were here Saturday to 
attend funeral services for their 
granddad, Quenton McCaghren 
and to visit their parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gary Pickrell.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Waymon Gordon 

were in Farwell Friday to attend 
funeral services for Carl Rundall.

***

Mr. and Mrs. C.V. Michael of 
Whorton have been here visiting 
her brother. Mr. and Mrs. 
Waymon Gordon and nephew, 
Mr. and Mrs. Philip Gordon and 
family.

***

Lt. and Mrs. Wade Knudson of 
Oak Harbor, Washington arrived 
this week to visit her grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. G.C 
Ritchie enroute to Maryland 
where Knudson will be stationed

the next three years with the U.S. 
Navy as a Navy test pilot. Mrs. 
Knudson is the former Kim 
Rylant.

* * •

Donald Doty of Lubbock visited 
Thanksgiving weekend with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Wayne
Doty.

Thanksgiving day guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Chester were their daughter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Terry Graves and 
Timothy of Littlefield, Mrs. Stella 
Chester and her sister, Frances 
of Hereford.

• • •

Rory Glidewell of Houston 
arrived to spend the Thanksgiv­
ing holidays with his wife and 
daughter and her family, Bonita 
West and family!.

***

Mr. and Mrs. Terry Lively and 
girls visited in Pampa with his 
parents for the Thanksgiving 
holidays.

•**

Visiting during the Thanksgiv- 
hilidays with Mr. and Mrs. 
Calvin Baker were their 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Jack Wood and girls of O’Donnell 
and Sheila Nations and family of 
Levelland. Joining them were 
Mr. and Mrs. Damon Provence 
and Mr. and Mrs. Corley Baker

and families. *
• • •

Rhoda Minyard has returned 
from Bandera where she went Jo 
attend funeral services for h£r 
sister, Larue Dyer.

***

The UMW met in the hom< 
Frances Potter on Monday,
21. Grace Lopes gave 
invocation and Dorothy 
gave the program on the last 
session on “Acts of Our Times” . 
Eloese Curry presidvd over the 
business meeting.

N ellie W illiams read the 
minutes of the previous meeting. 
The meeting adjourned with the 
reading of the Guild Benediction. 
Refreshments were served to 
Nellie Williams, Eloese Curry, 
Anita Wallace, Grace Lopes, 
Thelma Lewis, Jackie McAlpin, 
Mae White, Thettie Wf liter, 
Jennifer Horn, Dorothy Drake 
ar.d the hostess.

* « •

The UMW Christmas coffee 
was held on Saturday, Dec. 3 
from 10 a.m. to noon in the home 
of Jackie McAlpin.

*•*

Thanksgiving holiday guests in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Ves 
Patterson were their daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Moore of
Lampasses.

*♦*

Joe\ Kindle%•

CommisHioner, Free. 3
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804 E ave 4 
MueshoeTX 79347 
Decembr
Dear Santa? Ciaus 
*f How are yoy I’m fine please 

bring me oMisfits doll My mom 
wons perfume The Next toy i 
want is a teddy beard and o 
Chemiset Why do you tuch your 
nose?
Your friend 
Una Fried 
Mis Buise 
class room

***
018 w mf
Muleshoe, Tx 79347 
D ecem ber5,1988 
Der Santa,
f I’m doing my best in school. 

Santa will you please bring my 
mom a diamond ring for 
Christmas. Will you please dring 
iby Dad pop a shot for Christmas. 
Will you please dring me and my 
brother and my sister a teint are 
you Real 
Your friend 
Gyrus Norman 
mrs. Buie’s class

3J3E3rd
Muleshoe, Tx 79347 
December 1,1988 
Dear Santa,

I How are you? Please, Santa, 
bring me a Nintendo cassette, 
Sega System. Please bring me a 
bike. Please bring my dad a 22 
gun.

; What is your real name?
Yjour friend,
EUniel Navejar 
Mrs. Buie’s class 

• • •
1B04 W. AveG
Muleshoe, Tx. 79347 .
November 30,1988 
Dear Santa,

Would you please bring me Li 
Miss Make up? And 1 want Heart 
to Heart Baby. And Dress’n 
Dazzle. And Fashion Star Fillies. 
And 1 want snack shop. And a 
tenspeed.
Merry Christmas!
Nikki Atkins

•**

GRAIN PRICES 
FEED CORN. 4. 7Scwt 

WCY. 5.46 cwt 
RCY. 5.00 cwt 

WHITE FOOD CORN..6.85 cwt 
MILO..4.11 cwt 

SOYBEANS.7.20 cwt 
NEW WHEAT..3.50 cwt 

98Vi%
Prices December 9. 1988 ■ 

MARKETS COURTESY OF 
FARMERS CO-OP 

ELEVATORS 
Muleshoe, Texas 

2724335

Rt.2,Box 638 
Muleshoe, Tx 79347 
Decembers, 1988 
Dear Santa,

How are you doing? I’m doing 
fine. Please bring me one remote 
controlled speed boat, nintendo, 
my dog wicet, pet parrot, tent, 
two Dallas Cowboys helmet, 
remote-control aarmy tank, a big 
robot, BB gun, two Styroplane 
Penny fler, bring my dog a bone. 
What do you feed your reindeer? 
Your friend 
Greg Pena 
Mrs. Bui’s class

December 5,1988  
Dear Santa

I wanted to tell you what I 
wanted for Christmas. What I 
want for Christmas is a remote 
control car a nintendo and a bike. 
How are your elves and how are 
you. Are your eKes making alot 
of toyy for all the kids in 
Mwlshou. 
love you 
from Julia

606 E 5th
Muleshoe Tx 79347 
December 5,1988 
Dear Santa,

You will get a nother letter 
from me because I will be 
sending you a letter that will tell 
you what me and my brother 
want for Christmas. I wanted to 
ask you if Mrs. Santa Gues is 
doing and how the eves and 
Randeer are doing. I like you 
Santa Clues.
Love
Twyla Gear

• • •
Dear Santa,

How are you? I am fine. I have 
been a good girl this year and I 
want a bubble gum machine. 
Mostly I want a bike. I also want 
my own room so I don’t have to 
listen to my sister snore. Also I 
forgot to ask how your wife is. 
Also I forgot to say My name and 
age. My name is Stacy Harlan 
and I am 9 years old. Do you 
know what I really want? I want 
you to come see me. Also I don’t 
really care if you don’t bring me 
anything. Well we are fixin to go 
to music so I better go.
Love,
Stacy

Dear, Santa Gaus
I’ve been very good this year. 

Especislly for you! I would like a 
Mule Rock Cafe sweatshirt that 
has Muleshoe underneath 1 also 
want a California Grapevine 
sweatshirt. My brother wants a 
remote control car for Christmas. 
My sister wants a new coloring 
book. Bring my mother a new

SHE'S A SWEETHEART-And the Kiwanis Sweetheart, Justine 
Hanes. She was a participant in the annual Christmas Parade last 
Saturday. Believe the driver is none other than Kevin Harris, one of 
the newest Kiwanis ns. (Journal Photo)

parents game. Bring my father a 
one hundred dollars, 
age 10
Sincerly, Kermit Price 

• • •
Dear Santa,

I want new toys for Christmas.
I have been good very good this 
year.
Can you bring Something for my 
moma and my daddy. My daddy 
wants some Old Spice. My Moma 
Some clothes OK! My brother 
wants a Nintendo, 
name Tiffany Age 9 

**•
Dear Santa,

I have been very good this 
year. Santa My sister wantapar 
of earrings My moma want a 
dress for Christmas too ok: Santa, 
age 11 Your trend Shantel Hall I 
want a Barbie doll for Christmas 
Too.

««•
my nane Pancho Klassen 
I am 10 years old. This is my first 
Christmas in America. Please 
bring me a bike for Christmas. I 
have been good. Your friend 
Pancho

Dear Santa
„ This Christmas I want an I pm.-, 
take a bath with you cabbage 
patch kid and a big fuzzy brown 
teddy bear. Most importantly 
bring my mother and father a 
bunch of flowers but don’t forget 
about my brother, bring him a 
water bed.
Jennifer Patterson 
nine years old

• • •
Friona Hwy 
Muleshoe Texas 79347 
Decimber 6 
Dear Santa,
I want a telescope four Christmas 
because I have been good. My 
bother wants a color tre because 
he has been good My name is 
Panie I Morris I am 20 years old 
Your friend 
Daniel

724 S. Main 
Muleshoe Tx 79347 
November 30,1988 
Dear Santa Gaus 

How are you doing? I’m fine 
Please bring me a Care bear.

Afystik
JT-Bvipt StJvf 0"‘> M~'or O'J 
SAE 15W50 

*rt! tin (us Mums

Three-Way News 
b y : M rs. H .W . G a rv in

The Three Way basketball 
teams played Spade there Tues-, 
day night with Three Way 
winning both games.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. BUI Dole and, 

Darla were in Littlefield Tuesday 
on business.

• • •
J.W. Tyson visited his uncle 

and aunt, the George Tysons, 
Saturday.

**•
Mrs. Bobby Kindle had lunch 

Thursday with Mrs. H .W . 
Garvin.

Mrs. Bobby Sinclair and son 
from Monahans is visiting her .
parents, the BUI Duplers.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. W.T. Simpson 

and Inez Gark were in Lubbock 
Saturday visiting.

The farmers in the community 
have been very busy these pretty 
days with the harvest.

•** 1
Mr. and Mrs. Rodger Hatcher 

and daughter from Govis, N.M. 
visited her parents, the Jack 
Lanes’ Sunday afternoon.

The Three Way School spon­
sors a basketball tournament at 
the Three Way School the past 
w eekend. Three Way High 
School teams won first place. The " 
junior high boys and girls played 
too.

Please bring me a Barbie doll. 
Please bring me a Jem doll. 
Please bring me a Misfits doll. 
Please bring Octavia a doll. 
Please bring my sister a doll. 
Please bring Octavia a big 
unicorn. Please bring me a radio. 
Please Please bring me a univorn 
What do you feed your raindear? 
Your friend,
Connie Espinoza 
Mrs. Buies Gass

1401 W. Ave B 
Muleshoe Tx 79347 
Dcember 1,1988 

Dear Santa,
How are you? I’m trying my best 
in school. Do you know want I 
want I want Island Fun Barbie 
multiplication flashcards. When 
did you get married?
Your friend 
Becky Flores 
Mrs. Buies class 

• • •
Dear Santa Gaus,

I want a truck, a tractor, a 
horse, a whistle, a toy cowboy 
and a toy cow. Merry Christmas! 
Love,
Fermin Gonzales 
kindergarten, J4

Deaf Santa Claus,
Bring me my favorite toy.

Liz Torres 
kindergarten

> 1
" BUY HOW TIIHU JANUARY 20, 1909 & SAVE $$$$

GREEN -  DECK 21" SELF-PROPELLED WALK-BK1UND MOWERS W/BAGGERS 
LIST -  $648.00 SALK - $511.10 DEPOSIT -  $50.00

»* 7

STOCK NOS.

REAR

1260, 1787, 1789, 1788, 1790, 1776, 1779, 1777, 
1786, 6 1785.

ENGINE RIDERS -  BAGGER OPTIONAL
KX63 LIST - $1,249.00 SALF. - $ 927.00 DEPOSIT - $75.00

RX73 LIST - 1.351.00 SALE - 1,129.00 DEPOSIT - 75.00

RX75 LIST - 1,531.00 SALK - 1,267.00 DEPOSIT - 75.00 ♦
SX75 LIST - 1,785.00 SALE - 1,469.00 DEPOSIT - 75.00 • .
SX95 LIST - 2,126.00 SALE - 1,746.00 DEPOSIT - 75.00

LAWN TRACTORS - BAGGER OPTIONAL
LIST -  $2,199.00 
LIST -  2,529 k)0’
LIST -  2,969.00

LAWN EDCERS LIST -  $344.00

SALE -  $1,651.00 
SALE -  1.746.00
SALE -  2,325.00

SALE -  $277.00

PORTABLE GENERATOR LIST -  $720.00 SALE -  $554.00

DEPOSIT- $100^00 
DEPOSIT- 100.00 
DEPOSIT- 100.00

DEPOSIT -  $25.00 

DEPOSIT -  $50.00

Your deposit w ill hold your purchase. In te re s t f re e , u n t i l  
April 1, 1989.

Come in and check out our lin e  of JOHN DEERE chainsaws, ba ttery  
chargers, to o ls , & accessories.

DENT & CO.
HWY. 84 WEST 
MULESHOE, TEXAS 79347 
(806)-272-4296

JiuiH biiB yn-jdiiai.. ta' . D .jiinx
SALE PRICES APPLICABLE ON IN-STOCK ITEMS ONLY.

T&i

. 1  
JT7

Mirilt (ilirflfKP lubflc.Hll

SAT 80W 90
M l K l l  IONS- I WIMSIJ a

Pickup Windshields
For 1973 thru 1987 Models Q U A L IT Y

_  _________________  B p ' l l  S E R V IC E  P A R TS

$ 129.95 “
(Includes Windshield 

and labor)

OENIRAL MOTORS CORPORATION

ONLY FOR GM
V

Pickups, Suburban, 
Large Blazers 
1 (installed)

Safety Inspection 

On Windshield FREE

2-*00 West American Blvd. 
Muleshoe, Texas 7B347 

806/272-4689

ROBERT D. GREEN, INC.

MYSTIK OIL & GREASE 

DECEMBER SPECIALS!

5% Off Regular Price

Additional 5% On Deliveries 
Of Ten Cases Or More

•v’ a -

WESTERN “66” COMPAN Yl
Earth Highway 272-4556

We Will Meet Any locally Advertised 
Price On Mystik Lubricants

: ' •- ft <. i '•

is a
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J o t%  FoaU u. Tull«; G itlenirid , 
K e e jj ia  .G lo v er, S a u te  L a th am , 

B re ^ t  t in g ^ a u *  
,a ty  M o y a ,  f u s i g g  M c G u ire ,
[Hun Meggo*,.*, JOffcA M e ^ O ^ a ,

asu ii O sunu , S teafaaafe  . F e rftz  
a d  .M ia li  R U o u i^ o g

N i c ^  A lan is , B rooke B a t
_  l e t . .  J i ig iO  B a ifp u , KeUi C ak l-
”” .. w e l l ,  M a ^ p n  C o n k l in ,  G a i l
^ ^ — C o p io y , J e a n n e  ^C o*., M ri^ y

Saio#ut“ . V ir g ^ ia  S ie r ra , B te g k e ^  
Ŝ>ru {air, $onya Smith, Courtney 
T a r f s l e ) . .  J l c t t e  T h o m a s ,  
B re n n a  W h e c k *  . p h » @  v h * « ! ' 
er, Taralie Williams and And}
W ilsn n

H e u o r  A rz o la ,  A m a n d a  
A sh lo rd , D o ra  B a rre ra , M a tt  

Bradley,. Kristi 
C h u g  m a n .  K r f s t in  C h i tw o o d ,  
Son^a C isn e ro s , M o n ica  C le o ^  
m e n s ,  K r i s t i e  C o i i in s ,  N a ty  
D eRps S a n to s , C hri$  D o m in g u ez , 
Beejty D o n a ld so n , S u s ie  wd  
w a rd s , A m elia  F lo re s , S te g h a o ie  
F ra n c is , C a rip e n  F ran co , B o se  
M at;ic G lo ria , S h a p e  G lo v er, 
V e r o n ic a  G o n /:a le s»  R e b e c c a  
G re e p

A ls o  V a n e s s a  G r e e n h o u s e ,  
L a tn c i i  G u ie rre z , S tac ie  H a rr is , 
A pril Ffugw, T ohrny T srjuess. 
Jenxrifer ^ h n s u u ,  K yle  K eo -
m o r e ,  A n g ie  K in g ,  S t a c e y  
L a u g fitt , G onzalo  Lozano, S u sie  
M a r te l ,  A ida M a t t in e ? , E rie  
M clifroy , A lb e rt M e n d o z a , S a n d ­
ra  M e n d o z a  a n d  Sco tt M tr i -  

' m u « t e s ■-**>.. '«**■ *
Also Trat^y P ueR ett, B ry an  

R asgo . G ilro b e rt R en n e ts , S h a n ­
non R o b er t s o n , F a u la  B u th a rd t, 
B ianca  S an ch ez , M andy  S h ip - 
m a n ,  D o u g la s  S n e lr ,  B h o n a  
S te v e n s , Jo d y  T h o m a s . C art 
T u rn e r ,  J h s s ie  V illa rrea l, J o n  
R ob in  W a tk in s , S tev en  W a u so n , 

'  C ory  W e lc h , S o m m e r -Viley, 
D u s tin  W ilh ite  a d d  C o u rtn e y  
W illia m s

____  i~0 |M e£,
■litfz&CQVTX MUM IN PAMMA'~tx w eu„« o e e u iu u t  n ay  mt *h» t hr««ui.>^, ,Pai«*j.e. a n d  a lm o s t D a a e n g o r t ,  S h a w n  D e L a n e y ,

^ci*uaer ia a t  F r id a y . iW M u u is u w e  w in -S c o u ts  m a d e .. *,Tlou»rU uU  oi r id e r s  i s  th e ^ u id R l , ,  C a s k  E s te p , F r a i l s  F ran co ,
'r* u e  m  M u ie sn u e . ( J o n i j^ P h u * * ,)  C h * k  Frtufunaa, L en a  G a r d a ,

T o

HpykAi
B R E A K F A S T  

M ilk , H oney B ug*  a n d  Ju ie c
I U N O J

|
C hs*k  "Fre^iis^Q,  ̂£e«R  C ajcda , 
viapk Q a to a ,  wJo b « tiy  G o n za lez , 

-
L o r is a ^  H e iu le r ^ o n  a rid  L o ti  

’e d g e s .
A lso K rssu u  H ag iny j* , E v g e

I K e U e j ,  J o s *  I o * a n o A C h a 4

k *

D E t»  12-10 
m u tm m

l HfcArurA&£
Cinnamon T o a s t ,  A opie»fc.aw e 
ink M ilk

tu r n * -
Tacos, .k ^ n w r d r e e t t  uat«o*  ,F ru » t 
nu M ilk

r u s & f t t *
BHEAta-Aai 

D >nuis, f rUtt and Milk
LUMAaHr -

•»stt > rt«uw *cues, l a m a -  daw uc, 
r « K a  F*-ws,ftC o ie  u iaw .^C afce  

n u  MUk
W b i i m s b D A I  
a  K fcA ftJFA O l

Toast* Bacon aua Milk 
LUHfm

S'eaaaogwis. Potatoes ot Gravy, 
G reet* d e a o s .  H o t  R o tia . F n m  

n u  M ilk
H rtJK k P A l
StfcAJSd-AiJ

Cere***, J u ic e  » n u  m u r

Turney at L rrssu**, Potatoes .tic 
i ra v y . G reet*  P«*U k C ra u w e try  
S au v c , Hot. R o d s . Pectfctt P’«  a n e  
vlilk

R U J A i
BRfcAkhAbl

i)aaa» ,uauuw«u, j u«te auk Milk 
LU N ttJT

H auotK geas. Poaako* Cltvps, 
f a tu o e ig v *  oalazl* P’UUMCdi «utk 

Mik.
A L A U  l iA r i  M U r i i lA i  

tt«u vbDrikhilAz 
NMUfc I HRlsli WAX MEJtti 

I M U N iJA Jt
BRfcAftJrA^l

\p|Me ortcas, SaetNUifk - ’’a *  ana 
M ilk

LU B G ri
Mt«*; 1 n c a i u a w ,  pa*u*n Pice 
S au t* . £vUik a n a  C aac.

TGEhUAX
B R fc A is rA b tl

PnaaMBs* pyrttft. ► mac -uta Muk 
R LUNA1H .

GnUak cbeeatt t>Aou%wsaes, Poca 
&  - la a tu s  e m r y ^ a n w *  S tru ts , 
M ilk *< a i  ic e  C re a m

v fcD N A M iA X  
I W f t A A t A i t  

Cerctu*. J uu» aiH* Milk 
t.UNkJrit-:

f a t a e y  w iT r jm m w o it, G f e e a
Jatuis, C ra a w e u y  Sau*-e, Rwia, 
Walk ana U m sutaa .. uuumg

Hki&aUAi 
B R k A A P A R i

jelly, Juiuc ana.MU*.
i f a M f e t i .  H P M  ( | L  _ _

N lM M M L a k  i  h e s s e ,  S n u tk ik  xJ d k .T m ^ c y  d; D rea»u ig , G ibie* M cG oiin ick , .C h ad  M o p ig o m crj; 
S a u sa ^ ,3 ia«*eycui-eas baiao. ^ ra^* Gr^  Olivaicz, Brigft Osi^ia
Corn i i r e u o .,  MUk-auu-i-ru**. ! otatoes», ;̂ °A Rafts,

F R IftA k  ^ VAi^
B R fcA k JrA * !

iis c tu w  G rav y , B auun . M ie e  ^  d  p n ^ s w g .  jC r iW
MUk- G ra v y , G re g a , B e t^ * . .  C reag ie .4

LUNGJd- PtHUlttsai .̂ Hob R ofts^«4 *Fruk
h ie a e n  v a a a m c ,  . ru e  J ’ea* . ,10U 

C o te s d u v ,  R o d s ,  M UR. J e i l o  ^

—r
D a d d ' O th u fe Z ' Briwn O stg ia ,

ank^Fruk Douga Pusifeeti,. Steghaige
t a u a ,  Allis JWI, P iiey . B u lie o

v / io p in n g

I f n a i k  W w j i  . v i w u s

|A U DltvLT-MdfeJi

NiGNUAt
Wtktle*, ̂ yegiu,Juks, Mas,

n j i iS p A V
BiJUddd G rav y . R»#>A TWO?,

DEA~ 12-10 
M U W ilA U i

B MdEACU'AGl
MUR, ro a s t*  - id ly  a u d  r in tu .

I U N O *
M u r , ^ t e a a  k  G ra v y , C re a u m u  M lik - w k 1i *ib &ivav
P o ta u re s , ^  reta*  B e a n s ,  ri.ot R ods 
a n d  r r a a  C e re a t ,  J u ie e , M 4 k

CUSAftSA
MURu Men*, A  G ra v y .,C re a u u n i.
’O taioes*  screen  J e a a s * .r io t  R ugs u r r f l K l v

i  u U ,T ra il " N l w i T *

TW BilMi l LLN4IH.BUbAM-Abl
M ilg y P a a d a k e s*  - y r ^  .****& V^ iW*'  c , a
i n T f t a k  Fa*»U s, R e in e d  Begus*,. S a g i ^

LU N V H  VU***
MRR, H a m u u z g ^  L eim au  &  , TUfeS? ^ i ,
" c a m u u .P ie a t e s ^  G tuons*  l a t u n  ^ K a e n  ^ n e d  S t e | u , » 4 | M ,

P o o d d es* . G rjog ,. S a ^ d .  Rb M%..

B tuyviue Tru o ijt 22 IL m e t Mt^i,- 
day^ a ftecn o o n . D ee, ?  a t  th e  G u l 
S cun t H u i,. T W .;  in e e t in g ^ w a s  
o p e n e d  .w ith  t h ^  p ro m ise  a n d  

" p k d g c -  |
A fter th e ^ o p e m o g  ce re m u n x . 

t  a iris m a d e  C h ris tm a s  n .a  
w u s  ♦<> 4-ut • i, h e^C ffu is tn .as  ^  

t r e e  a t *-be C tr l  S cou t 
G eiuce. X tk iga , J t o o p  t e a s e r .

TnwrtTafMrsJm WfesFng
ts triejniy way to find out for sure what 
nutrients are needed to make their fields 
pi educe optimum profit yields. We can 
arrange a professional soil test for you,

___ ____ Ihep help you use the results to develop
„.$pz&rprograth that's exactly right. So call new.
’hen ijt CQmesJo Keeping Crops Profitable with soil 

lesdfig, wi ' re the people to see.

T a c o ,

#  - W
G irls  p re sd irt a t  th e  n re e ig in g  

were, tian  PhRfiSj Cynthia 
- suaueo* , p e ^ D e * M r g j i s ,  s ^ i .  
v u . i a s t  T o r i  T o s J c  J e n n i f e r  

C a a to r e n a  a n d  A n g e la  C a s

S & M l 1 M t e s c 3 8 M ! &

MgR, J  efty, .vrth f r u i t . ,
T o ts  and*Co©o*ei

~tm m )  i Ihh i
F luor, H a m o u tg e r s ,  L e tiu o t &  v'bU^SlfW
T o n o u o . Puuuita % C fH ous, Tare* ’ ll*** <Bn-idOs»
T o ts  anW C ooiR ei 'uao.es*

W tck}!+m**X M g i .  ice  v  r a t i f tvHRiJuSSi 1
M lik , J a u u e n * . C iw oM uon l  ’d e k  
t u k f n u i .

L U N Q k .
MUR., T a t p s , % le a n s*  'a* d d .
< harese, .C ty v R c ii a n ^ .ie f t f t

C U M kN i
Mgfc., r T f t l T i i  34*n*G* s a tn o ,
C o rn -B n sau  t u u  a e d o  IHAlR̂JAX 

B iib A k fA c * !
iritu . C b a e se . l o a s i  .o a k  f  r*ut

L G IW ji
M gk, H er Dugs* p« * k b t  J a n u s .
P o ta to  <uau, P o an u i B ette*
C y u e e u a n

u n m
MtiR. J a in .  &  -b a tto t  D g  B e n ,
Po«A *StA Beans,., i 'o ta to  >a»dd,
P e a n n i Jeere*  * ou ie»aiou

Ifil

I s  C y i e b t  u a t i #

FK O JA j
H M H P M

U w  k i H i t u b

I O r llU O R iiA tU kO a*.

C k l i k

U * i e >  iu O (rM A g >

G r u a u t i  J U m ^  >

j r a - H b U -

2 i k i i

M i

j; x

4<h V w  Z

■ v

I

?  i f  *  .

t  J H r ^ u a  v ,  I h f i k *

i U t

4 iU MK t> erf H u ite iw v

Htult ^ v z u m

Vi! \mt Ufe* lU ieze*led i0t ’uaJsHAg a. 
ih u  f/K H  KaekUteUMMA ^Vu'koruv

h k a c  tiw M W  i ( * u u  u u u m u  M v U  4 »  U » 0 O

Omy*. C ocM C R

UabetkiR ikhJNV’* Httttt iRIkc  2*s5*HkW'

i ' u i 's. w h I  IfiruvkiA l>is v w k

V O r

V m c  ^  -

V c  « » % ,  « r

r

»RHi^Ue
t r i U U k

W  d < H M * 4  W W w ,  U kH H y\

A e t l  A h W W W *  ^

k » H b
O C X 0 :v 4 i
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‘Sudan News
B y: E v elyn  R itc h ie

Harbor, Washington following a 
visit here with her mother, 
Geneva Thomasson and aunt, 
Jerry Herzog.

Opal Pennington was in Pep on 
Thanksgiving day when she met 
her daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Gerik for dinner there.

•* *

Jackelyn Ford has been in San 
Angelo this week to visit her dad 
and grandparents.

•* *

Tammi Gore was home from 
college during the Thanksgiving 
holidays with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Gore.

Lauri Ann Damron was home 
from college for the holidays with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Julian 
Damron.

« •*

Michelle and Dawn Gaston 
were home for the holidays with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. Wix 
Gaston and grandmother, Mrs. 
Tray Gaston.

***

Frank Garza returned to the 
services to North Carolina on 
Wednesday morning after having 
been here for the Thanksgiving 
holidays with his mother, Mrs. 
Celia Garza and Angel and other 
family members.

*•*

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Taylor were 
in Plainview during the holidays 
when they joined their daughter, 
Sherribob there for dinner and 
also attended the Queens Classic
basketball tournament.

***

Thanksgiving holiday visitors 
with Bonnie Roberts were her 
son, Mr. and Mrs. Daryl Roberts 
and family of Mineral Wells.

***

Betty Rickard was recently 
taken to the Amherst Hospital 
when she fell and reportedly 
broke her foot.

***

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Salem 
visited in Dallas during the 
Thanksgiving holidays with their 
daughter, Better Korioth and 
family.

• • •

Andrea Thomasson Hall has 
returned to her home in Oak

Kiwanis View 
Video Showing
On Patriotism

By R.A. Bradley
Eleven Kiwanias braved the 

slick streets this morning and 
met at the Old Corral. President 
Keith Turner called the meeting 
to order. Hugh Young led the 
club in the pledge to the flag. 
Dale Berry gave the invocation. 
Kevin (Meat Head) Harris, said 
that since he had known a person 
so long and knew the lettering on 
a certain sign that was put on the 
back of the car that he drove in 
the Christmas Parade to let our 
sweetheart Justine Hanes ride 
in. Since Kevin knew the person 
who printed the sign he gave the 
Friendship coin to R.A. Bradley.

Hugh Young had the program. 
Hugh had a short video on 
America-the beautiful and 
wonderful things we have as 
American’s. Hugh reported that 
he had the priviledge of speaking 
to the 6th, 7th, and 8th grades at 
school during their patriotic 
week. Why we should be proud 
to be American’s, be proud of our 
flag and what the flag should 
mean to each of us. Why we 
celebrated some holidays. Why 
we observe Memorial day why 
we observe Veterans day. Hugh 
brought a very good program. 
Even with all the faults of the 
United States of America. We 
should be proud to live in this 
country. We have so many things 
to be proud of. We are so 
blessed. With the winding up of 
another year we should be so 
thankful for everything.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnathan  
Robertson vacationed during the 
Thanksgiving holidays with ’heir 
parents.

Hereford Tractor & 
Equipment AUCTION

L o c a t e d  S  m i le *  n o r t h  o f  

H e r e f o r d  o n  H i g h w a y  3 8  S  

Next Sale:
Thursday, D ec . 15
Starts at 10 a.m. c.s.t.
Selling ell classes of farm 

machinery, construction equip­
ment. trucks A pickups.

Call To Consign

364-8542
Quinton Jenkins,
The Auctioneer
T x. Lie. No. 6630

e e a

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Kent of 
Lubbock visited during the 
Thanksgiving holidays with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Pat Kent, 

eee
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Don 

Dudgeon and son of Dimmitt 
visited during the Thanksgiving 
holidays with his mother, Mrs. 
Winona Dudgeon and other 
family members.

eee
Mr and Mrs. Eddie Bond and 

daughter of Vega visited during 
the Thanksgiving holidays with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Seymore and brother, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Wayne

Seymore and familly.
eee

Lowell Ford of Dallas visited 
during the Thanksgiving holidays 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bernard Wilson.

eee
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Fields and 

children of Lubbock visited  
during the holidays with his 
mother, Mrs. Juanda Fields and 
Gary. Also visiting were Debbie 
Bingham and Allyson.

eee
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry ray spent 

the Thanksgiving holidays in 
Edinburg with their daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Williams, 

eee
Thanksgiving holiday guests in 

the home of Mr. and Mrs. Glen 
Chester were their children and 
families and his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dorman Chester.

eee
Deborah King has been a 

medical patient in the Amherst 
Hospital this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Cardwell 
were recently in Bay City to 
attend funeral services for his 
niece. They also visited in 
Greenville with his mother, Mrs. 
Hal Cardwell and other family 
members.

Louise Kessler, Jr. has been 
hospitalized this week following a 
car turnover near Bull Lake 
Sunday afternoon when Bill 
Gardner and he were enroute 
back *o San Angelo following the 
Thanksgiving holidays here. It 
was reported that Bill was not 
injured.

*•*

Mrs. Beryl Lance has been 
hospitalized this week in the 
Levelland Hospital.

.' ***

Dan Wood was released  
recently from St. Mary’s hospital 
and is recuperating at home.

***
Cleo (Son) Whitmire was 

released  Monday from the

Methodist Hospital and is slowly 
recovering at home.

• • •
Thanksgiving holiday visitors 

with Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Carson 
and Angie included Mr. and Mrs. 
Max Ball of Arlington, Margaret 
Stone, Craig, Kathy, Susan and

Lee all of Anton, Mr. and Mrs. 
Herb Funk of Littlefield, Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Reese and Philip a  
and Paul of Midland and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ralph Funk and Chris of 
Perrin. They all had dinner in the 
home of their mother, Mrs. Frida 
Cunningham in Littlefield.

Caring For Muleshoe Area Families, 
Sinoe 1959

•* ' ' «

Ellis Funeral Directors •
272-4574

Pre?i\eed Funeral Plans
• **iv

Monuments 
Granite-Marble-Bronze

3

Immaculate Conception 
' Catholic Church

Fathert Patrick Maher 
Northeast of City

First Baptist Church
220 West Ave. E.
Barry Bradley,Pastor

Emmanuel Baptist 
Church
Iglesia Bautista Emmanuel
107 East Third
Isaias Cardenas,Pastor

Trinity Baptist Church
314 E. Ave. B.
Rev. Dale Berry

Circle Back Baptist 
Church

r

Intersection FM 3397 &
FM 298 
946-3676

Calvary Baptist Church
1733 W. Ave. C.
Rev. Danny Mann

Muleshoe Baptist 
Church
8th and Ave. G.
Bob Dodd,Pastor

Progress Baptist 
Church
Charles Fisk,Pastor 
Progress,Texas

Richland Hills
Baptist Church
17th and West Ave. D.
Allen Petersen, Pastor

St. Matthews 
Baptist Church
Corner of West Boston &
West Birch 
M.S. Brown,Pastor

|  Progress Second 
 ̂ Baptist Chlirch

^ 1st and 3rd Sunday 
Clifford Slay, Pastor

The Community Church
Morton Hwy.
Jim Cope, Pastor 
965-2356

Church Of The Nazarene
9th and Ave. C.
Dennis Hayes.Pastor

$
. W . w .

ROTECTION FROM THE ELEMENTS
It has been said in the Lone Star State that there is nothing between Texas and the 

North Pole but a barbed wire fence. That certainly gives you the idea that in Texas you’re 
not given much protection from the cold North wind.

There are times when you might think there is no protection and comfort afforded 
from the hardness and cruelty of the world. But there is a buffer between you and the 
world. This help and protection is the church. As members of the church, you are with 
good people of like minds who love you, pray with you, comfort you and assist you. They 
are the ones who "bytooe serve one another.” (Gal. 5:13)

We invite you to attend the church of your choice this week. You will find a warm 
welcome there.

"And this commandment we have from him, that he who looeth God love his brother 
also."
I John 4:21

1

Th* Church it God s appointed agency in (hit world for sprtoding the knowledge of His love 

for man and ol His demand far man fo respond to that lave by loving his neighbor. Without 

this grounding in the love of God, no government or society or woy of life will long 

persevere and the freedoms which we hold so dear will inevitably perish. Therefore, even 

from o selfish point of view, one should support the Church for the soke of the welfare 

of himself ond his family, beyond that, however, every person should uphold and par­

ticipate in the Church becouse it tells the truth about man's life, death and destiny; the 

truth which oione will set him free to live os a child of God.
®Col*man Adv. S«r„

Western Drug

Lazbuddie Methodist 
Church
965-2121
Larry Reid Farris,'Pastor

St. John Luthem
Sunday School and Bible 
Classes 9:30 a.m.
Church Services 10:30 a.m. 
Rev. Mac Bearss,Pastor
United Pentacostai 
Lighthouse Church
207 East Ave. G.
Rev.J.A. Torres

114 Main 272-3106

Little Gulf
(202 W. Amer. Blvd. 272-4918

Fry & Cox, 
Inc.

401 S. First 272-4511

Main Street 
Beauty Salon

115 Main 272-3448

Irrigation Pumps 
& Power

West Hwy. 84 272-4483

TemploCalvario
507 South Main 
Sunday 10:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7:00 p.m. 
Evangelistic Services 
J.L. Soto,Pastor

El Divino Salvador 
Methodist Church
5th and Ave.D.
Jose M. Fernandez,Pastor
Lazbuddie Church 
Of Christ
965-2932

Jehovah Witness
Friona Hwy.
Boyd Lowery,Pastor

New Convenant 
Church
Plainview Hwy.
Sunday 10:00 a.m. 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m. 
Jimmy Lowe,Pastor
1st Baptist

Church
Lazbuddie,Tx. 965-2126 
Gary Wilcox,Pastor

Primera Iglesia 
Bautista
223 E.Ave. E.
Roy Martinez,Pastor

Lariat Church 
Of Christ
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 & 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Services 7:00 p.m. 

...... Sam Billingsley,Minister

Muleshoe church 
Of Christ
Clovis Hwy.
Bret McCasland.Minister

16th & Ave. D.
Church Of Christ
Sunday 10:30 a.m.
Evening 6:00 p.m.
Wednesday 8:00 p.m.

First Assembly 
Of God
Rev. David C. McCune 
9:45 Sunday School 
11:00 Morning Worship 
6:30 Evening Services 
7:30 Mid Week Services 
272-3984

Primitive Baptist 
Church
621 South First 
Elder Cleveland Bass,Pastor

Spanish Assembly 
Of God
East 6th and Ave. F.
Mike Doyle, Pastor 
10:00 Sunday School 
11:00 Morning Worship 
6:00 Evening Service 
7:30 Mid-week Service 
272-5455
First United 
Methodist Church
507 W. 2nd Street 
Richard Edwards,Pastor
Truth Tabernacle 

(Pentecostal Church)
200 E. Ithaca 
& Fir
Pastor: Les James 
272-3391

*

•••
• #

Attend The Church 
of Your Choice

Boh Stovall 
Printing

221 E.Ave. B. 272-3373

1st Bank
202 South First 272-4515

Farmers Co- Op 
Elevators

113 N. 1st 272-4335

American Valley. 
Inc.

W.Hwy. 84 . 272-4266

James Roy 
Meat Market

506 W. Amer. Blvd. 272-4361

Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. D. 272-4288

Foster 
. Fertilizer

Lazbuddy

v">

Dairy Queen
1204 W.Amer. Blvd. 272-3412

Robert D. Green, 
Inc.

2400 W. Amer Blvd. 272-4588 £

Lookin Good
206 Main 272-5052

5-Area
Telephone Co- Op
302 Uvalde Inc. 272-5533

Richland Hills 
Texaco

1914 W Amer. Blvd. 272-4875)
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272-4536

CLASSIFIED 
?  RATES 
Minimum Charge 

S2.30

Consecutive 
Insertions 

Minimum Charge 
S2.00

CLASSIFIED 
DISPLAY RATES

SI. 75
Per Column Inch

DEADLINES' $
12 noon Tuesday 

For Thursday Paper 
12 noon Friday 

For Sunday Paper 
We reserve the right 

to classify, revise, or 
reject any ad. Not 
responsible for any 
error after ad has run 
once.

1

1. Personals
FRANK’S

Refrigeration & Ap­
pliance Service Parts 
& Repairs. 
f 817 Gum 

Muleshoe, Texas 
79347 

PHONE
l  Home 272-3822 
f l-6s-tfc

STORAGE ROOMS A 
office space for rent 
call 272-4754. 
sl-53s-stfc

1 Call your local used 
cow dealer for 7 day a 
week dead stock remo­
val. 965-2903 or 1-800- 
692-4043.

, cl -37t-tfc
i-Y

A FAST EXPANDING 
BUSINESS

Add to your income.
& Build your own future 

while working parttime 
from home. Call 246- 
3454.
NEED lady to do light 
housework and cook­
ing for elderly couple 
in Muleshoe. Phone 
806-933-4418, Sudan.

I ^l-49t-tfc_
WOULD UKE TO DO 
housekeeping Mon fri. 
Call 272-3963. 
U-49t-2tc
WANT TO BUY house. 
Good 2 bedroom, 1 or 2 
bath that can be 
moved. Call Barney 

, Scheller 806-965-2766 
pl-49t-3tp

A n  o p p o r t u n ity  to  

s h a re  th e  B ib le .

W r it e  P . 0 .  B o x  7 5 3 ,

M u le s h o e .

3. Help
Wanted

MAN EXPERIENCED 
in irrigation well re­
pair. Call 806-238- 
1596 day or 238-1328 
nights. 
b3-49s-tfc

FIRM NEEDS mature, 
pleasant typist-recep­
tionist. Computer, ten- 
key. Experience pre­
ferred. Fast-paced of­
fice. Some overtime 
required. Mail resume 
to P. 0 . Box 786, 
Earth,TX 79031 
m3-50s-4tc

4. Houses
For Rent

FOR RENT IN Mule­
shoe: 3 bedroom  
house, garage, fenced 
back yard. Call 965- 
2881. 
p4-50s-2tc

)

IPCONCERNED 
About Someone’s 

Drinking?
HELP IS 

AVAILABLE 
through Al-Anon 

Call 272-2350 or 965- 
2870 or come to visit 
fuesday flights,* 8jD0 
p.m. or Saturday mor­
nings at 10:30 a.m. t 
and through AA call! 
965-2870 or come 
visit Tuesday nights, 
8:00 at 620 W. 
Second. Muleshoe.

3. Help Wanted

APPLICATIONS are 
being accepted by the 
Muleshoe Chamber of 
Commerce and Agri­
culture for the position 
of Manager. Appli­
cations may be picked 
up at ‘the Chamber 
office at City Hall, 215 
V First. 
m3.49s-tfc

5. Apts.

10. Farm Equip. 15.Misc. 15. Misc. 8. Real Estate JJ.Real Estate B.Keal Estate

For Rent
APARTMENTS FOR 
rent: Good Locations 1' 
and 2 bedroom fur­
nished or unfurnished. 
272-7575 
p5-38s-tfc

18. Legals
NOTICE OF

OPPORTUNITY 
Notice is hereby 

given that South Plains 
Community. Action 
Association Inc. is 
seeking .... Financttf 
Assistance from the 
U.S. Department of 
Transportation under 
the Section 18 Grant 
Program. Grant funds 
will be used to contin­
ue providing Rural 
Public Transportation 
on a demand response 
and fix schedule bases 
with 24 hour notice. 
These services are for 
all com m unities in 
Bailey, Cochran, Gar­
za, Hockley, Lamb, 
Lubbock, Lynn, Terry, 
and Yoakum Counties. 
During this period this 
system will purchase 
computer and office 
supplies, fuel, main­
tenance, contractural 
services, printing ser­
vices, insurance, and 
(4) four vehicles.

Special Provisions 
for the Elderly and 
Handicapped are avail­
able. The system will 
charge a small fee for 
transportation but 
those unable to pay for 
something will be 
worked out through 
one of the programs 
with South Plains 
Community Action 
Association Inc. Copi­
es of the grant pro­
posal are available for 
inspection by the pub­
lic at 411 Austin 
Street, Levelland.

Any person wishing 
to request a public 
hearing in the propos­
ed project must submit 
that request in writing 
to South Plains 
Community Action 
Association Inc., 411 
Austin Street, Level- 
land, Texas prior to 
Dec. 12, 1988. 
sl8-49t-2tc

9. Automobiles 
Fgr Sale

1980 MAZDA RX 7, 
56,000 actual miles 26 
mpg: Great student 
car, Excellent condi­
tion. All offers consid 
ered. Must sell now. 
Call Mark after 5 p.m. 
272-3581. 
w9-50s-ltc

Few Sale
NEW HEAVY-DUTY 
Stock Panels 12 ft., 16 
ft.. Round bale feeders 
Hay, trailers.
Kenneth Wilhite 272- 
4975.
wl0-50s-tfc

11. For Sa l e 
Or Trade

BRAZOS RIVER 
RANCH

ALLEN MOUNT 
Hay for sale, custom 
plowing or shredding. 
Call 965-2470 or 272- 
5451.
pi 1 -49t-4tp

ANTIQUE CLOCKS 
make a beautiful 
Christmas present. I 
must reduce my collec­
tion and have several 
to sell. For appoint­
ment call 272-5203. 
pll-49s-4tp

HAY FOR SALE: 
wheat/alfalfa mix and 
side oats grama grass.
Call Buster Evins at 
272-4934. 
fll-47t-tfc

Eternal Female 
Wife: “I’ll be ready to 

leave in a few minutes.” 
Hubby: “Don’t hurry, 

dear. I have to shave again.”

Kirby
Safes and Service

1012 E. 3rd, Portales, N.M. 
Call for service or free home 
demonstration on ‘89 model 

Kirby.
Call 1-505-356-6110

JoAnn Chester 
Realty 

Five Bailey County 
Farms of 1,235 acres 
with 531 acres dry 
land, 504 acres irrigat­
ed with pivot sprinkers 

South of Muleshoe 
806-227-2368

NICE 3 bedroom, 2 
bath house, 2 miles 
w est of M uleshoe. 
With large bam. Nice 
location. Call 946- 
3340. 
d8-25s-tfc

Mon. only 

9 * 4 *

Mon. only

9*4"

s Recycling 
CASH

For aluminium cans 
Also copper-brass-radiator

Scrap alimuinum
Top prices paid 

At Allsup's on Am. Blvd.
Please help keep our city dean-'recycle'

Mon. only 

9 * 4 "

Mon. only 
9 * 4 *

8. Real Estate

The Amorous One
Bobby, do you ever peep 

through the keyhole when I 
am sitting there with your 
sister?

Bobby—Sometimes— 
When mother ain’t there!

True Enough
Reporter: “And what 

would you say has been the 
chief source of your strength 
and health?”

Centenarian: “Vittles.”

8. Real Estate

JAMES F. HAYES & CO. 
AGRICULTURAL REAL ESTATE

Vic Coker -Agent
2 LABORS SOUTH OF MULESHOE 

.Longview Area, Good Soil, fully allotted 
Call for more details.

• * * *

FERTILIZER A GRAIN Facility in Earth - 
30’XllO’ office & warehouse, 70 ft. 100,000 
pound scales, 2 steel grain storeage bins 
with pit & leg, other improvements, all 
located on 9 acres.

•* *  —

2-160 Acre tracts northwestern Lamb 
County good water-2 wells on each farm 
good soil; lay good, Immediate posession.

***

1-210 Acre Farm-Lamb County: Steel barn *, 
& other improvements, 2 wells lots of 
underground pipe good soil & lays good.
Immediate possession available.

------ —  •* *
640 ACRES NORTH OF LAZBUDDIE- ON 
PA VEMENT , 1 sprinkler, good soil water, 
some grass.

• • *

120 ACRES WEST of Muleshoe. Will 
accomodate sprinkler. Good opportunity for 
first time buyer.

***

NEW OFFICE 
310 MAIN SITTE 103 

272-3100 
home 965-2468

Call Vic for Farm A Ranch Appraisals

BINGHAM & NIEMAN REALTY
116 E. Ave. Q. 272-5285 or 5286

PRICES REDLCED UP TO $7,000 on 2 & 3-1-1 Bti£k Homes, Cent, heat, Energyi Efficient. 
PRICED FROM S23,500! 11 Approx. $600.00 total move-in, payments based on income for 
qualified Buyers! II

RICHLAND HILLS
IMMACULATE 3-2-2 Brick, comer lot, 
Cent. A&H, built-ins, FP, loads of storage & 
closet space, much morel

*****

PRICE REDUCED-3-1-1 Brick, Cent. Heat,
Evap. air, built-ins, fenced yard......

* • • • •

JUST LISTED-Very nice 3-2-3 Home, Cent. 
A&H, built-ins, FP, fans, spklr. sys., 
fenced. PRICED TO SELLIMM...
JUST LISTED-VERY NICE-3-2-2 Brick 
Home, Cent. A&H, built-ins (inc. kitchen 
ctr., compactor, & microwave(, Jacuzzi, 
loads of storage, basement, aut. sprklr. sys.
& Much More! 1! 111!

*****
HIGHLAND AREA

JUST LISTED-4-3 Home, good location, 
fenced yard, storage bldg. PRICED FOR 
QUICK SALE!!!!!

JUST LISTED - Nice U rge 2-2-2 Brick, 
Cent. A&H, utility, cov. patio, fenced yard 
& more!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!
; VERY NICE 3-2-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, newly 
remodeled kitchen with built-ins, storm 
windows, fenced yard, storage bldg, and 
much more!!!!!

* * * * *
NICE-3-2-2 Brick Home (2 story), on comer 
lot, Cent. A&H, built-ins, and much more.
LET’S LOOK TODAY!!!!!, 60 s

*****
2- 2-1 carport Brick, Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
fenced yard & much more. PRICED TO 
SELL!!!!!

SB- t
Nice 5-3 Brick Home, Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
utility earthtone carpets, covered patio, 
fenced yard & much more. S60’s! 11! I 

*****

JUST LISTED-nice 3-2-1 carport home, 
approx. 1800’ of Iv. area, fenced yard, 
workshop-stroage area. Much More.PRIC- 
ED TO SELL!!!!

*****

JUST LASTED-Nice 3 - lt t - l  Brick Home, 
Cent. A&H, built-ins, large den w/fire- 
place, fenced yard, storage bldg. $50’s!!ll!I

HlGff SCHOOL
3- 2 *  Brickf2 carport. Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
fenced yard. Eff. Apt. or workshop &
storage area. $40’sl!!l!

•**•*.
3-1-1 home, comer lot, Cent. A&H,
built-ins. $30’s ......

“•***.*
PRICE REDUCED FOR QUICK SALE! Nice 
2-1-1 Home, Cent. Heat, carpets, work- 
storaae area, and much more. $19,950.00!!!

IMMA CULA TE-3-2-1 f2 carport, Brick 
Home, Cent. A&H, built-ins, nice finished 
basement with fireplace, sprklr. sys., & 
much more!!!!!

• • • • •
8% A.P.R. FINANCING TO QUALIFIED 
BUYER on this 3-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, 
built-ins, 2 fireplaces, nice large rooms, 
sprinkler sys.!!!!!

*****
LENAU ADDITION

COZY 3-1V4-1 home. Cent, heat, nice 
earthtone carpets, fenced yard, storage 
bldg., & more!!!!!

*****

3-1-1 home, Cent. A&H, utility, storage 
bldg., cellar, gas grill & more. S20’s ! !!! 1 

*****
' COUNTRY HOMES

2-2-1 brick home on 1 acre on pavement, 
close to town, Cent. A&H. $40’s!!M!

• • • • •  »

HOME TO BE MOVED. Nice 4-3-2 Home.
Cent. A&H, built-ins, fireplace, loads of
storage & closet area, 2150 sq. ft. of living
area, much more, $40’s !!!!!!!!!!!!!— *****
2-1 home, 20 acres, sub. pump, sprinkler, 
barns & corrals. $40’s!!!l!
____  ***** __

•Nice, well maintained Self-Service Uundry.
34 washers, 16 dryers in nice, modem 
building, excellent location. Books available 
to qualified Buyer. . . . . .

SALE OR LEASE nicfly remodeled office 
bldg, with over 3,000 sq. ft. of area, 
excellent location across from Courthouse. 
PRICED TO SELL!!!!!

*****
PRICE REDUCED- Nice* ” £V ick  on 1.267 
acres, built-ins, Heat & Air,
ceiling f*nV S  C» j improvements, fruit 
trees!!!!! .Y s

,  • • • * •

APPROX. 3,000 sq. ft. bldg. Railroad 
frontage. CASH PRICE $15,000.00.

• • • • •

69t acres, improved pasture, 8” well, 
undgrd. line, fenced, plus nice 3-2-2 home, 
Cent. A&H, built-ins, utility, storm cellar, 
rttee shop. & much more, close to town!!!!1 

*****
VERY NICE- 3-2-1 Home on 1 acre, close to 
town, Cent. Heat, Evap. air, nice carpets,
nicel/remodeled. $30’s!!! 11 

* ••••

' GEORGE NIEMAN. BROKER

Whitt-Reid
Real Estate

Homes, Farms, Ranches, Commercial 

201 Main 272-361.1

- r t

SMALLWOOD REAL ESTATE 
232 Main Muleshoe , 272-4838*

3 Bedroom, 2 Bath Stucco House. Close to 
DeShazo School. $500.00 down payment.

• • •

3 Bedroom, 1 Bath, 1 Car Garage Brick 
Homes, Starting at $23,500.00 Around 
$650.00 to move in.

* * •

R tA LTO H -j^J^udderth, TZcaftf. *?hc.
109 RFTH STREET

(806) 481-3288 FA RM , TEXAS (806). 481-9194
Rfeahors Certified Appraisers 

HAVE BUYB0
WE NEED FARM LISTINGS NOW

18. Legals

88-774-838 
NOTICE TO 

CREDITORS OF THE 
ESTATE OF 

PHYLLIS P. BEAV­
ERS (SMITH), 
DECEASED 

Notice is hereby 
given that original 
Letters Testamentary 
upon the Estate of 
PHYLLIS P. BEAV­
ERS (SMITH), Deceas­
ed, were granted to 
CHESTER CLAY 
BEAVERS on the 28th 
day of November, 
1988, by the County 
Court of Lubbock 
County, Texas. All 
persons having claims 

1 against said estate are 
hereby requested to 
present same to him 
within the time presc­
ribed by law. The post 
office address for these 
purposes is:

Estate of PHYLLIS P. 
BEAVERS (SMITH).

Deceased
C/o Crenshaw, Dup­
ree & Milam 
P.O. Box 1499

Lubbock, Texas 79408 
Attention: Jerri Ham­
mer

CHESTER CLAY 
BEAVERS
Independent Executor 
of the Estate of 
PHYLLIS P. BEAV­
ERS (SMITH), Deceas­
ed.
cl8-50s-ltc

8. Real Estate
FOR SALE: 2 bedroom 
1 bath mobile home on 
60 x 100 lot with 2 car 
carport in Country 
Club Addition.
Cal l
Call: 925-6480 after 
dark.
08-45s-tfc

Wrong Cure
“Well, Doc, you *:urt 

kept your promise when you 
said you would have me 
walking in a month.”

“Good, I'm glad to hear 
that.”

“Yeah, I had to sell my 
car when I got your bill."
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PRE*CHRISTMAS
, / f

h a lf  h a m s
2 TO 4 LB. AVG

WILSON CERTIFIED BONELESS FULLY COOKED 
9 6 %  FAT FREE-6 TO 8 LB. AVERAGE

WHOLE HAMS 
$ J 39

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF 
WHOLE IN THE BAG

B R IS K ET S
WRIGHT S HICKORY SMOKED

SLICED SLAB BACON . . .  LB
$ 1 19 SHURFINE WHOLE HOG REG./HOT ? Lfl R

PORK SAUSACE S J .77
1 IB 
ROLL

$ | 3 9
LEAN MEATY-3'/?-5V> LB AVG WHOLE $  1 3 9 ARMOURS PRE COOKED CHICKEN FRIED $ | 3 9
PORK SPARE RIBS . . .  LB BEEF PATTIES . LB.
GOOCH GERMAN BRAND $ 1 3 9

WISCONSIN RED RIND OR COLBY JACK-MARKET CUT $ |  9 9^SMOKED SAUSAGE 12 OZ. 
. . . PKG. L0N6H0RN CHEESE IB

8 TO 12 
LB. AVG.

1 V i LB. LOAVES

%99
Is-

4 ROLL PKG.
FOR YOUR BATHROOM

- ,  DELSEY
Dels*!/) u s s u l

ALL TYPES 12 OZ. CANS

COCA
COLA 6 PK

32 OZ. BTL. 
DEL MONTE

FOR GIRLS OR BOYS 
66 SM ./48  M E D ./32 LG.

LUVS DIAPERS
BOXM J

32 *41

t  \\T
C OR D CELL 

DURACELL

b a t t e r ie s2 PAK

RALSTON
W \  C0RN/ RICE/ WHEATCHEX CEREAL

12-16 OZ BOX

<*** $ 1 9 9

WASHINGTON EX. FANCY 
DELICIOUS

RED APPLES

. 49*

TOMATO
CATSUP

DEL MONTE 
STEWED

TOMATOES
1 4 Vi OZ CAN

- J m

RUSSET

DEL MONTE

SPINACH
15 OZ CANS

DEL MONTE 
CS-WK GOLDEN

CORN
17 OZ. CANS

r

v

75* OFF LABEL 
W/ FABRIC SOFTENER

FAB
72 OZ BOX

5 LB 
BAG

LB

$ 1 5 9

FROZEN
BORDEN 

6 PK.
NUTTY BUDDY

10 CT PKG I TRONOLANE

CREAM
1 OZ TUBE

SHURFINE 
ASSORTED

MELLORINE
Vi GAL CTN

GORTON'S CRUNCHY 
FISH FILLETS OR

STICKS
8 OZ PKG

FRESH

TEXAS ORANGES
RED RIPE

TOMATOES
PRfSH A  $ 100WHITE ONIONS 4  lbs * 1
NEW CROP a m « o

PECANS lb 5 1 3*
NEW CROP

ALMONDS OR WALNUTS L, 9 9 c

P O T A T O E S

20 LB. 
BAG

DEL MONTE 
CUT/FRENCH

GREEN BEANS
16 OZ CANS

FOR

$ 3 .0 0  OFF LABEL 
PURINA

DOG CHOW
50 LB BAG

SNACKS

BUGLES
16 OZ PKG

V.

Fv

5  u',’. BAYER
i 200 CT BTL

$ 6 "

CLEAR EYES
_ _  MURINE PLUS OR I  MOUTHWASH

mUjcesi MURINE LISTERINE JSTTRI
5 OZ BTL |  18 OZ BTL

SHURFINE
TATER

NUGGETS
24 OZ PKG

fWFFILIATED
Ifoodsinc.

MtMMRSTOKf

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
DECEMBER 11-17, 1988

t h r i f t m a

DAIRY DELIGHTS
MINUTE MAID CHILLED 
REG./COUNTRY STYLE

ORANGE JUICE
96 OZ CTN

SHURFINE
QUARTERS

MARGARINE
1 LB PKGS.

2
FOR

WE A C C EP T  F O O D  ST A M P S .. .  WE RESERVE TH E R IG H T T O  LIM IT

BORDEN SHURFINE
Vj GAL HALFMOON CHEDDAR

CHEESE
8 OZ PKG

$ 1 2 9
ri HOMO MILK

$ ]0 9

=


