
Coyotes Claim 6th 
Straight District Title

Dare to Live 
Without Limits

By Bryan Golden

Determination
By Coach Richey

The 2013 version of the 
Borden County Coyotes may 
have not taken on the appear­
ance early of what was first 
thought they would look like 
with all but two players hav­
ing little to no varsity experi­
ence heading into the 2013 
campaign. However, that did 
not stop this group from hav­
ing the same goal when the sea­
son began, with that goal be­
ing a 6® straight district cham­
pionship. In order for the Coy­
otes to accomplish this goal, 
the Coyotes would have to 
travel to play the teams that 
were projected to finish 1-2 in 
the district. In fact, after only 
beating the Cougars a week 
earlier by the score of28-26 the 
Coyotes were a 24 point under­
dog according to several dif­
ferent polls. That however did 
not discourage this young 
group of Borden County Coy­
otes.

With the district champion­
ship on the line the home town 
Wildcats got on the board first 
taking an early 8-0 lead with 
7:51 left in the first. That 
would be the only lead the 
Wildcats would have during 
the course of this title tilt. The 
Coyotes as they did most of the 
evening scored very quickly as 
Corbin Sumners, following the 
superb blocking of end/full­

back Tristen Benavidez, Guard 
Nathan Ham, End Colby 
Pennell, Center Frank 
Banman, fullback Korbin 
Martinez, Quarterback Riley 
Herridge, sprinted 51 yards on 
the Coyotes first play from 
scrimmage. Herridge added 
the point after as Michael Tay­
lor snapped to the holder Ma­
son Coor making the score 8-8 
with 7:42 left in the first. The 
Coyote defense of Banman, 
Benavidez, Jayton Lewis,

Hunter Jones, Sumners, 
Pennell, and Korbin Martinez 
forced a turnover on downs. 
On the Coyotes second play 
from scrimmage Jones scam­
pered 48 yards to the end zone 
and with the Herridge kick 
Borden County had a 16 to 8 
lead. The Coyote defense 
forced a fumble that Korbin 
Martinez came up with and 
then Herridge found Korbin on

Determination is an essen­
tial component of all accom­
plishments. Determination is 
the drive that keeps you going 
in spite of obstacles and adver­
sity. Determination is your 
mental adrenaline. When the 
going gets tough, determina­
tion will keep you going. If 
you feel discouraged, tap into 
your determination.

The more intense your de­
termination, the more effective 
it will be. Determination is not 
casual. It is a deep-seated de­
sire to succeed. A person with­
out determination will give up 
at the first difficulty. “I’ll give 
it a try,” is not a statement 
made by a determined person. 
Rather they will proclaim, “I’ll 
get it done.”

Attempting to reach a goal 
without determination is ho 
different than trying to drive a 
car without fuel. When driv­
ing, in order to go up hill you 
must give it more gas. When 
facing an obstacle, you have to 
use determination to overcome 
it.

Can you imagine an Olym­
pic skier about to start his 
down hill run telling himself, 
“I’ll just give this a try and see 
what happens.” Of course not. 
Anyone with that attitude 
would be lucky to just finish 
the course.

Every competitive athlete is

determined to win. No contes­
tant enters his or her event with­
out the goal of victory. An in­
dividual with sheer determina­
tion can finish ahead of some­
one with more natural physical 
ability.

What about a person starting 
her own business? If she is 
going to succeed, she has to be 
determined to do whatever is 
necessary. If she just put up an 
open sign and waits for custom­
ers, the odds for success are 
very slim.

Invariably, it’s the deter­
mined business owner who suc­
ceeds. She puts in the time and 
makes whatever sacrifices are 
necessary to make her enter­
prise prosper. Just like the ath­
lete, the successful business 
person envisions victory before 
the doors even open.

A determined job candidate 
will often be hired over some­
one with more experience but 
lacking a resolve to excel. 
Many employers realize that 
although most people can be 
taught job skills it’s virtually 
impossible to instill determina­
tion.

As children we are told sto­
ries of the power of determina­
tion. The tortoise and the hare, 
the little train engine that could, 
David and Goliath, to name just

(Continued to Pg. 4)
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Senior Runs All the 
Way to Round Rock
By Coach Skelton

Three seniors got out of the 
suburban early Saturday morn­
ing at Mae Simmons Park in 
Lubbock to compete in their 
last Regional Cross Country 
Meet. The mood was upbeat 
and somber at the same time 
all three realizing the clock is 
winding down on their high 
school playing days. Jordan 
M artinez was still super 
pumped over the Coyotes 6th 
district clinching title win over 
the Grady Wildcats the night 
before. He was not 100% for 
his final race due to a leg in­
jury suffered the night before. 
However he wasn’t going to 
miss this race for anything. 
Taylor Gass and Kalyn 
Massingill posed for pictures, 
talked about where to eat after 
the race and got several hugs 
from family, friends including 
a coach who also is very aware 
of the limited amount of time 
he has left with these kids. The 
gun goes off and I walk over 
to my normal roost to get ready 
to tell the girls what place they 
are in and to holler out encour­
agement. I knew before the 
race that Taylor was sitting 
roughly 14th in the region at 
shared with her after our sec­
ond Mae Simmons event of the 
season that puts her in a place 
to have a shot. Early in the 
year I did something I have 
never done as a track coach, I 
put the watch up except for a 
few select workouts. We 
started placing importance on 
placing rather than times. This 
approach seemed to relax the 
runners more and they begin to 
understand that a time on 
course X usually doesn’t trans­
fer well to course Z. Flash 
forward back to Saturday Tay­
lor came by the first check 
point in 15th place running re­
laxed and Kalyn came by in the 
60s range. I began to head over 
to my next spot on the course 
and I notice Taylor is setting 
12th about to come down the 
last hill on the back side of the 
course. I make her aware of 
where she is and holler her to 
get down that hill. She said 
later she didn’t hear me, but 
she could see how close she 
was and realizing that 10th goes 
to State committed to making 
a run at it. I knew when I saw 
her commit to sprinting down

the hill she was going to go for 
it. Kalyn in her own right, had 
made a move up to the mid- 
50s. I was setting at my final 
spot which is at the 400 meter 
mark of the course and Taylor 
had moved up to 11th. I tell her 
again how far it is and where 
she is setting and to let her 
know that she is in a pack of 4 
girls and she needs to start 
working to get in front of them 
and don’t let anything pass her 
after the bridge which is 
roughly 200 meters from the 
finish line. She immediately 
lengthens her stride and pushes 
in front of the pack put her 9th. 
The pack she’s running with 
pass 1 girl before the bridge 
and she’s setting 8th. I then lose 
sight of her and focus on get­
ting to Kalyn which had 
pushed up to the mid-40s with 
400 meters to go. Kalyn does 
the exact same thing Taylor 
does and she starts to gradu­
ally lengthen her stride and 
starts gaining on people before 
for the bridge. The bad thing 
about being on the back side 
of course is you can’t cross the 
bridge to get the finishers un­
til the last runner is off the 
course. When I get to the fin­
ish line I can tell from 
everyone’s reaction that she 
had finished in the top 10 and 
she actually finished 7th. Kalyn 
moved up enough to finish 40th. 
Taylor finished 7th with a time 
of 12:31.6 and Kalyn finished 
40th with a time of 14:00. The 
boy’s race started soon after the 
girls finished, and as I coach I 
mixed emotions about Jordan 
running. He had run so awe­
some at the district meet and 
is such a super competitor that 
being injured I knew he 
wouldn’t be able to do what he 
wanted. Jordan to his credit 
did the very best that he could 
muster never once shying away 
from representing his commu­
nity, school, family, nor him­
self in a way that showed ev­
eryone what it meant to be a 
Coyote. I was super proud of 
him and after the race just gave 
him a hug and told him how 
awesome that was.

Taylor will be running this 
Saturday November 9th 2013 in 
Round Rock at Old Settlers 
park at 9 am.

State Qual

Borden County senior, Taylor Gass (center) competed in the Regional Cross 
Country meet this past Saturday at Mae Simmons Park in Lubbock and 
qualied for the state meet by placing 7th in the meet. The state meet will 
take place on Saturday in Round Rock.

Canyon Speech Tourney

Nathan Souder (left) and Zach McMeans placed at the Canyon 
High School Speech Tournament November 2. Zach won first and Nathan 
sixth in Student Congress, a new UIL event. The two along with Mollie 
McMeans will compete in Lubbock November 12 in the Region XVIIDistrict 
Contest. Also traveling to compete in Canyon were Mollie (Student 
Congress), Kassie Gaines (poetry), and Robert Jordan (quarterfinalist 
qualifier in poetry).

School Lunch 
Menu

Nov. 11-15, 2013
Menu subject to 

change

Monday - Breakfast: 
Mini Pancakes & Sausage, 
F ru it Ju ice and M ilk. 
Lunch: Chicken Quesadilla, 
Salsa, G arden Salad, 
Refried Beans, Applesauce 
and Milk.

Tuesday - B reakfast: 
PB&J, Fruit Juice and Milk. 
Lunch: C ountry  F ried  
Steak, M ashed Potatoes, 
Green Beans, Roll, Straw­
berry Cup and Milk.

Wednesday - Breakfast: 
Mini Com Dogs, Fruit Juice 
and Milk. Lunch: Chicken 
Fajitas, Tortilla Chips (9-12 
grade only), Charro Beans, 
Com, Salsa, Orange Smiles 
and Milk.

Thursday - Breakfast: 
Blueberry Muffin & Yogurt, 
F ru it Ju ice and M ilk. 
Lunch: Popcorn Chicken, 
Garden Salad, Baby Car­
ro ts, A pple S lices, 
Breadstick and Milk.

Friday - Breakfast: Ce­
real & Animal Crackers, 
F ru it Ju ice and M ilk. 
Lunch: Fish Strips, Texas 
Toast, Sweet Potato Fries, 
Coleslaw, Sliced Peaches 
and Milk.

This institution is an equal
opportunity provider.

The
Borden

Star



The BORDEN STAR, Wed., Nov. 6th, 2013...3

Coyotes Defeat Wildcats 93-68...
(Continued from  Pg. 1)

Coyote JV Splits 
Two Games with 
Klondike and Grady

a 4th down play connecting 
with a 36 yards pass play and 
following another Herridge 
kick the visiting team had a 24 
to 8 lead.

Just when it appeared the 
Coyotes might be taking con­
trol of this title contest, the 
Wildcats would not go away. 
After driving for a score to cut 
the lead to 24 to 16a Coyote 
fumble gave momentum back 
to the Wildcats and just like 
that in a two minute time frame 
the score was tied at 24. That 
would be the last time these 
two teams would be tied as 
Borden County capped the 
scoring in the first quarter as 
Herridge hit Pennell with a 50 
yard scoring strike. Herridge 
followed the pass play with an­
other successful kick and a 32 
to 24 lead after one period of 
play. The Coyotes got another 
defensive stop and Herridge 
and Pennell connected again, 
this time from 19 yards out and 
another Herridge kick made 
the score 40-24. The Wildcats 
answered to cut the lead to 40- 
32. Herridge found Tristen 
Benavidez in the back of the 
end zone on the Coyotes next 
possession and after yet an­
other successful kick following 
the 8 yard hook up Borden 
County had a 48-32 lead with 
4:05 left in the half. The Wild­
cats scored with 1:05 left in the 
half but missed the extra point 
and the Coyotes still had a two 
possession lead with a 48-38 
score. Borden County drove 
the ball down the field and with 
a perfect pass from Herridge to 
Korbin Martinez with 3 sec­
onds left in the half the Coy­
otes extended their lead to 54 
to 38. They faked the point 
after kick to hopefully make 
the score a three possession 
lead and with the perfectly ex­
ecuted pass play from Herridge 
to Nathan Ham the Coyotes 
had a 17 point lead at 55 to 38 
heading into the locker room 
and 20 minutes away from an 
amazing district title.

The Coyotes got the ball to 
start the second half. On the 
first play from scrimmage 
Sumners sprinted 65 yards out 
running two players that ran on 
a couple of relays at the state

track meet last spring. After 
Herridge split the uprights the 
Coyotes now had a 25 point 
lead at 63 to 38. Another stop 
later, the Coyotes seemed to be 
taking complete control of this 
contest. Hunter Jones found 
Trisfen Benavidez with a 
throwback play and the result 
was a 24 yard scoring play and 
a 69 to 38 lead. On this play, 
Herridge tweaked his knee and 
would not return. A bad snap 
kept the Coyotes from convert­
ing the extra point and with 
6:23 left in the 3rd Borden 
County had a 31 point lead.

The Wildcats got on the 
board with 5:13 left, but the 
Coyotes as was the case all day 
answered every Wildcat attack. 
This time it was another quick 
drive and another long run by 
Sumners, this time from 54 
yards out. Frank Banman 
filled in for Herridge kicking 
and Jones filled in under cen­
ter. Banman made the extra 
point to make the score 77 to 
46. The Wildcats again would 
not go away as they cut the lead 
to 77-54. The Coyotes an­
swered again, this time from 51 
yards out. Banman split the 
uprights for the two point kick 
and a commanding 85-54 lead 
with 1:33 left in the 3rd. Borden 
County got another defensive 
stop and moments later Jones 
found Banman deep in the cor­
ner of the end zone with a nice 
throw and catch from 37 yards 
out. Banman hit the kick as 
well and the Coyotes were a 
score away from being over 
with a 93 to 54 score. Borden 
County got an interception on 
the next defensive possession 
as Korbin Martinez stepped in 
front of an errant pass with 
6:52 left.

The Coyotes put in their 
second team offense and de­
fense. They were unable to 
convert on a 4th and 3 play to 
turn the ball over to the Wild­
cats. The Wildcats keeping 
their starters in managed to 
score with :25 left and then 
following a successful on-side 
kick the Wildcats had a final 
score with :12 left and a final 
tally o f93-68, but more impor­
tantly a district title. This was 
a complete and total domina­

tion in every phase of the 
game. What a day to put it all 
together.

Statistic Leaders for the 
Coyotes:

Corbin Sumners had 15 car­
ries for 266 yards and 4 scores, 
1 reception for 30 yards, 
Hunter Jones had 11 carries for 
111 yards and a score and was
4 of 7 for 106 yards and 2 
scores. Jordan Martinez had 
6 carries for 20 yards. Korbin 
Martinez had 2 catches for 45 
yards and 2 scores, Colby 
Pennell had 3 catches for 80 
yards and 2 scores. Tristen 
Benavidez had 5 catches for 58 
yards and two scores. Frank 
Banman had a 37 yard recep­
tion and riley Herridge was 8 
of 14 for 150 yards and 4 
scores. Nathan Ham had a 
catch for 3 yards and a point. 
Michael Deax, Michael Tay­
lor, and Mason Coor all got 
action on both sides of the ball 
toward the end. Benavidez had
5 tackles, Pennell had 8 tack­
les, Sumners had 7 tackles and 
a tackle for loss, Jones had 10 
tackles. Korbin Martinez had 
9 tackles a tackle for loss, a 
fumble recovery and an inter­
ception. Nathan Ham had 4 
tackles with a sack. Frank 
Banman had 8 tackles. Jayton 
Lewis had 5 tackles, Michael 
Taylor and Michael Deax and 
Mason Coor all had 2 tackles.

The 2013 District Champi­
ons, will play host to the 
O’Donnell Eagles for home­
coming and the senior final 
home game. Senior Tristen 
Benavidez has been a Coyote 
his whole life and what a 
dream come true to win your 
fourth straight district title. 
Michael (Bill) Taylor has been 
a Coyote for 5 years and has 
been a member of a district 
championship his entire foot­
ball career. The final senior is 
Jordan Martinez who came to 
us last year and walks away 
with his second district title.

Congratulations guys for 
your accomplishments, but 
more importantly for believing 
in each other while others 
around you saw things a little 
differently. What a great ride, 
but we are not done. Home­
coming 2013, make it a suc­
cess and a perfect district 
record getting ready for the 
play-offs. Thank you parents 
for all of your help. Take care 
and God bless, TR

By Coach Benavidez

The Borden County JV 
team hosted the Klondike JV 
Cougars on October 24, 2013. 
As always, the Coyotes were 
undermanned and undersized 
compared to the visiting team. 
This however did not affect the 
young Coyotes. Borden 
County drew first blood with 
6:11 to go in the first quarter 
on an 8 yard run by Nathan 
Souder. The PAT failed. The 
Coyote defense stood strong 
and held Klondike on downs. 
The Coyotes found the end 
zone once again on a 5 yard 
pass from Robert Jordan to 
Dylan Murphy. The PAT once 
again failed. The next posses­
sion for the Cougars was futile 
as the Coyote defense once 
again denied them the end 
zone. U nfortunately, the 
Borden County offense stalled 
too.

In the second quarter, the 
Coyote offense got back on 
track as Nathan Souder scored 
from 38 yards out. This time 
the PAT was good as Robert 
Jordan found Jaden Huse for 
the 1 point pass to make the 
score 19-0. The Cougars fi­
nally found the end zone on a

23 yard run, but the PAT failed 
as the score was now 19-6. 
Kace Lott connected with 
Dylan Murphy on a 20 yard 
pass to extend the lead to 26-6 
as the PAT failed. The Cougars 
were able to score twice more 
in the game to make their score 
19. However, the Coyotes were 
also able to score twice more 
themselves. Both scores came 
on runs of 14 and 3 yards by 
Nathan Souder. The final score 
was 39-19 Borden County. 
Nathan Souder finished the 
night with 238 yards rushing, 3 
TD’s, 9 tackles, and 1 QB pres­
sure. Kace Lott had 16 yards 
rushing, 2 passes for 36 yards 
and 1 score, and 6 tackles. 
Braxton Coor had 9 tackles and 
1 catch for 14 yards. Dylan 
Murphy had 31 yards receiving 
and 6 tackles. Robert Jordan 
had 14 yards passing and 6 
tackles with 1 QB pressure. 
Diego Bernal finished the night 
with 9 tackles and a QB sack. 
Hunter Huse finished the night 
with 5 tackles and a PAT catch. 
Great job, guys.

Halloween night presented a

(Continued to Pg. 8)
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Slow Cooking Versus Fast Food

Dare to Live. . .

Opening the front door on a 
cold evening and smelling the 
delicious aroma of beef stew 
or barbecued pork ribs from a 
slow cooker can be delightful. 
First of all, it is great to have a 
tasty dinner ready and waiting 
for you when you get home. 
Secondly, it can prevent you 
from stressing about what to 
fix for a meal and perhaps hur­
rying through a fast food drive- 
thru.

With a slow cooker you can 
cook larger quantities and 
freeze the extra for future 
meals. Meal preparation varies 
by the meats, vegetables, and 
seasonings you choose. Try a 
beef roast with mushrooms, 
potatoes, and onions and on 
another day chicken with an 
Asian flare including carrots, 
green peppers, and soy sauce.

Since you control the ingre­
dients in the slow cooker, this 
type of cooking can be a 
healthier choice than high-fat 
fast foods. Cooking meat at a 
low temperature over time can 
make tough cuts tender, and 
the best cuts for this are usu­
ally the least expensive. Cuts 
of beef such as a shoulder, 
round, or rump roast can make 
flavorful dishes in a slow 
cooker.

Saving time is an added 
benefit of slow cooking. Place

ingredients in the cooker in the 
morning and you can return 
later to a tasty and low-cost 
meal for your family.

Beefy French Dip Sand­
wiches

This recipe is a great ex­
ample of using a less expensive 
cut of meat to make delicious 
sandwiches just cooking at a 
low temperature for a long pe­
riod of time.

Ingredients:
• 3 pounds beef roast such 

as round, chuck,
or rump
• 1 package (1 ounce) dry 

onion soup mix
• 3 cups beef broth
• 8 whole-wheat hoagie 

buns
Directions:
1. Wash hands with warm, 

soapy water.
2. Trim roast of any excess 

fat. Place in slow cooker.
3. Add broth and soup mix.
4. Cook on low for 8-10 

hours.
5. Remove beef from cooker 

and place on cutting board. Cut 
meat across grain into thin

slices or shred.
6. Place meat on buns and 

use broth for dipping.
Serves 8
Source: University o f Wyo­

ming CentSible Nutrition  
Newsletter

Two miners had been searching 
for gold for months. Their efforts 
went unrewarded until one day 
when they struck it rich. They did 
not want anyone to know where 
they discovered their fortune” until 
they staked their cl^im. But they 
needed supplies badly.

They decided to go into town, 
buy what they needed, tell no one 
of their d iscove ry and return to their 
cabin.

H o w e v e r in spite  o f th e ir  
silence, after they returned to their 
cabin, a large crowd appeared. In 
spite of their silence, everyone 
knew of their joy and happiness. 
Their faces gave away their story.

Whatever we have on the inside 
always appears on the outside. 
When God resides within us, His 
glory will be reflected through us, 

One day Moses met with God, 
When he returned to his followers, 
his face glowed with God's glory, 
letting the people know that he had 
been with God.

When you and I spend time with 
God, reading His Word, spending 
time in prayer, others will know 
that we have been with Him. it will 
show in us and through us.

Visit m at: SowwMimtri&s.org

Borden
Countv

Museum

The Borden County 
Museum 

will be open 
Saturday; Nov. 9th 

10 a.m. - 2 p.m.

(Continued from Pg. 1)

a few. As you mature, you for­
get these lessons.

You allow yourself to get 
discouraged at the very point 
where you need to apply more 
determination rather than give 
up. Unless you give your car 
enough gas, not only will you 
be unable to make it up a hill, 
you risk rolling backwards.

Especially if you stumble 
and fall, use your determina­
tion to get back up. Don’t 
make excuses. Don’t blame 
anyone or anything. Just get 
back on track. It’s not magic, 
it is determination. You may 
have forgotten how to use it, 
but it’s inside you.

On the other hand, it’s hard 
to be determined to obtain 
something you don’t really 
want. You can’t live someone 
else’s life or fulfill externally 
imposed goals. If you can’t 
muster up any determination 
you may be on the wrong path 
or targeting an undesirable re-

sult.
There is nothing wrong with 

changing your direction. If you 
are not excited about your path, 
pick another one that you can 
get more enthusiastic about. 
Too many people spend their 
lives in pursuit of the wrong 
goals and therefore have little 
or no determination.

So when these people sub­
sequently fall short of success, 
they conclude they are a fail­
ure when in fact they have been 
chasing the wrong dreams. 
Without a change in strategy, 
they are destined to an endless 
cycle of frustration.

Make sure you are on the 
right path. Fire up your deter­
mination. Keep going and 
never give up. Bryan is a man­
agement consultant, motiva­
tional speaker, author, and ad­
junct professor. E-mail Bryan 
at bryan@columnist.com or 
write him c/o this paper. Ó 2006 
Bryan Golden

f you’ve been waiting for 
the perfect time to get 

Broadband internet 
the time is N O W !

SION UP FOR 
POKALANIBRO’S 
BROADBAND INTERNET 
BY DECEMBER 2ÖTH!
YOU’LL GET:

Vou could WIN a 
46” HD SMART TV!

Just in time 
for the holidays!

*  FAST, RELIABLE BROADBAND INTERNET WITH UNLIMITED ACCESS
* FREE INSTALLATION,—  AND
* A CHANCE TO WIN A 46 INCH INTERNET-READY HD TV!!

r ^ P O K A L A M B R O
www.poka.com

S6Ú US Hwy 87 
NoITahoka 

880-422-2387

1647 Ave J 
Tahoka 

808-561-56Ö0

115 W Main St 
Past

806-990-9981

307 HIM Ava 
Ssagraves 

806-387-3333
12/20 /13 . OmyeatSBiviCB agreement reqüuoé. mmsUnispfcrAM ibps. 

or faster. Subject fc? credit, approval Other rastrtetos may appfr. S&s mre for áela4&

http://borden.agriife.org
http://a%5e'illfeextensionbordenfcs.wordpress.com
mailto:bryan@columnist.com
http://www.poka.com
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Following tie Pep Pally 
Friday, Hoy. 8tt 

In me sclool cafeteria

BrongM to yon by
The Class of 2014

&  ta in a  C o m m u n ity , (Z n n u a l 

M c v w e ó t tD in tw c

Sunday, Afauemttex 10, 2013 
a t 12:30 p.tn.

a t the if  lams Community Gente*

fPet £uch-lf lease ttxiny 2 of 
you* famxitô dhkeô

£adieô m ill âe a t the center on 
Saturday, Afauemttex 9th 

ta clean and set up tattico.

Homecoming Dance 
to be Sponsored by 
Booster Club Nov. 8

‘Thought
for

the ‘Day
Faith given back to 
us after a night o f 
doubt is a stronger 
thing, and far more 
valuable to us than 
faith that has never 

been tested. 
-Elizabeth Goudge

The Borden County Booster 
Club will be sponsoring a 
dance on Friday, November 
8th.

All Jr. High, High School 
and Exes are welcome. It will 
be held at the Borden County 
Event Center immediately fol­
lowing the BordenCounty vs. 
O ’Donnell football game. 
Classes are responsible for 
providing the food for the 
dance:

Seniors-Desserts; Juniors-

Finger foods; Sophomores-Fin- 
ger foods; Freshmen-Chips and 
Dips and Junior High-Food of 
choice (if you do not have a sib­
ling in high school).

Booster Colub will provide 
all the drinks and paper goods. 
Come out and support our 
Borden County Coyotes and af­
terwards join us for some good 
music, fellowship and tun. Go 
Big Blue!

For more information, con­
tact any Booster Club Officer.

Ho-we, fo r  fite s
Thursday, November Z T  

at C:O0 p.m.

Borden County Event 

Center,  Gad

Join us for a fun and educational program focusing the 

Christmas season. We will have a tasting of several recipes 

and participants will make a decorative Item to take home 

and will also receive a recipe booklet to take home. (Note 

that the project is always something that does not require 

a lot of creativity - so please to not let that intimidate
you!!)

Cost is $15 per participant to cover supplies.

Please RSVP by 5:00 p.m. on Tuesday, November 19th so 

that we may purchase supplies. {Note - you may still attend 

if you do not RSVP by the deadline, but you may not get to 

make a craft to take home.)

Texas A&M  Agriüfe Extension Service— Borden County
P.O. Box 155 Gail, TX 79738 
Phone: 806-756-4336 
Pax: 806-756-4486 
http://borden.agniife.org 
julie.smith@agnettamu.edu

¿ T E X A S  A & M .

/f f iR lL lF E
E X T E N S I O N

Facebook page: Borden County Extension and 4-H

K7<? will seek to provide alt reasonable accommoda­
tions for q8  pe/sons with disabilities for any Exten­
sion program We request th a t,o n  ronton your 

Texas MeM AgrtUfe Extension Service office as soon 
as passible to advise i f  you require auxiliary aid ,

Educational programs of lbs Texas MM AqdJa Enferman Sarei» me. cpen to as.pee&e mitnoul regard to mce, color, mx, dlsatMy, religion, a$a. or mftaned «¡fcfo 
The terns A&M Onfemfy System OS, OefiartmMatAgffci&ute, sort ite OxafyG&imf$sxx*rs Courts«# Texas CcepatsiXig

http://borden.agniife.org
mailto:julie.smith@agnettamu.edu
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Pups Whip the 
Wildcats in 
Home Finally
By Coach Richey

The Borden County Pups 
played host to the Grady Wild­
cats in the home finally for the 
junior high with the hopes of 
improving to 7-0 on the sea­
son and 2-0 in district. The 
Pups defense set the tone early 
as a big hit forced a lose foot­
ball that was scooped up by 
Nick Proulx and one play later 
Trace Richey hit Morgan Wil­
son on a nice 37 yard pass play. 
On the point after attempt, the 
second team of Payton Merket, 
Clayton Addison, Thomas Nix, 
JW Nix, Riley Lewis, Kable 
Kleck, Tanner Harrison, Jer­
emy Souder, and Lukas 
Grantham again took their turn 
on the field. On this particu­
lar point after, Merket hit 
Kleck in the back of the end 
zone for the successful try and 
a quick 7-0 lead. The defense 
of Wilson, Proulx, Richey, 
Brian Torres, Braxton Barnes 
and Ryan Willbom forced a 
quick 4-out and on the first 
play Proulx rumbled in for a
13- 0 lead before a Merket to 
Addison pass made the score
14- 0. On the next defensive 
possession Kable Kleck recov­
ered a loose ball giving the

Pups another possession. Just 
before the end of the first quar­
ter Proulx raced in from 24 
yards out and with a Lukas 
Grantham run, the Pups had a 
21 to 0 lead after one period. 
After forcing a punt early in the 
2nd quarter, Richey picked up 
the rolling punt and returned it 
46 yards to the end zone and a 
27-0 lead. The Wildcats man­
aged to get on the board return­
ing the ensuing kick-off against 
the second group making the 
score 27-6.

On Borden County’s first 
offensive possession of the 2nd 
quarter Richey hit Willborn 
with a nice 43 yard pass play 
down to the 3 yard line. Brian 
Torres covered the final 3 yards 
and pushed the Pup lead to 33 
to 6 and after a Riley Lewis to 
Clayton Addison pass play for 
the point after, Borden County 
was in control with a 34 to 6 
lead. Thomas Nix and some 
of the other second team de­
fenders got on the field on the 
next possession and Nix took 
advantage of the opportunity as 
he intercepted an errant pass

(Continued to Pg. 7)

Coyote Pup, J. W. Nix (#19) runs for the Coyote endzone in hopes o f  scoring 
against the Wildcats while Peyton Merket (#10) holds o ff the opponents.

E X T E N S IO N

F e r a l  H o g  M e e t in g

N«v«n*l*er 1.2 , 2013  

9 :0 9  <*,m. — 1.2 :0® *w»ip*»

Bprlfes* C«»n*y Kvtoi*
M«gisir*Oois F ee  S I S  - I m M M

R:30 .... 999ml 
9:00.....1®:®0 a.m ,

10:00 .. . 10:30 a.m<

10:30... 11 x©0 a.m.

The Good* T h e Bad, The 'U gly ~
K en  C earfcv, Teams A<feM A g r i l i fe  Bsitemkm  Service

H ow  Feral H ogs A ffect T e x a s  W ik tlife ..
Bee**« Tucker, Texas Parks &, W ild life  • Borden C o , G am e W arden

Feral Hog: Diseases «Bteetmg Livestock mad Humans - 
M ik e  Btsdmehmfc, S la te  D irec to r fee  T e x a s  W ild life  S e rv ice s

11:0 0  .. • 12 :00  gum. Trapping System s and B o g  Buying:. Station 
Jason Bond, Snyder T exas

L u n ch

For mare information, please contact;

Cody G, Hitt, CEA- A.G 
Texas A 4kM  Ag.ril.ife Extension Service 

Borden County 
£06-790-01121

I f  you need »peckil assistance in order to participate its this activity, please contact 806-756-4336

Bof«íe« c&íissty P a Hex tSS Y«*. 9Ô&7S&A338 
3P»x,.

X&jcm Agtt&Sfc •¡tá&S&tl■.<&&&#■ fa «WHfc i#»**»: » f e i - f f f -Tsx*&9 &&M $psfiím. Ó¡O0í»&s*9f*l ««*##>*• i

Legal Notice
The State of Texas 
To: MOLLIE EILEEN  

CASHMORE, MARILYN 
HARTCORN TORRITO, 
SUSAN MARTONE, 
TALISHA MAXWELL, 
VIRGINIA BERRY, REV. 
JAMES E. LEATH, DR. 
LOUIS AIELLO, DR. 
STANLEY GOODMAN, 
NORWALK YMCA EN­
DOWMENT FUND, MAR­
GARET JEWETT, MID- 
FAIRFIELD HOSPICE, 
DONNA A. WALTERS, 
GERI MALONEY, BRYNN 
RANSLEY, PATRICIA 
HOGAN, and JOANN E. 
DAVEY, and if deceased, the 
legal representatives of said 
Defendants and the unknown 
heirs of said named Defen­
dants, the legal representatives 
of the unknown heirs of said 
named Defendants, if the un­
known heirs of the said named 
Defendants are dead. 

GREETINGS:
You are commanded to ap­

pear by filing a written answer 
to the Plaintiff’s petition at or 
before 10:00 o’clock a.m. on 
the first Monday after the ex­
piration of forty-two (42) days

from the date of issuance of 
this citation, the same being 
the 3 - day of  December 2013, 
at or before 10:00 o’clock a.m., 
before the Honorable 132nd 
Judicial D istrict Court of 
Borden County, at the Court­
house in Gail, Texas. Said 
Plaintiff’s petition was filed on 
the 10 day of October, 2013, 
the File Number of said suit 
being No. 1234. The names of 
the parties in said suit are:

O’BRIEN RESOURCES, 
LLC, as P laintiff, and 
MOLLIE EILEEN
CASHMOER, MARILYN 
HARTCORN TORRITO, SU­
SAN MARTONE, TALISHA 
MAXWELL, VIRGINIA 
BERRY, REV. JAMES E. 
LEATH, DR. LOUIS 
AIELLO, DR. STANLEY 
GOODMAN, NORWALK 
YMCA ENDOWMENT 
FUND, MARGARET 
JEWETT, MID-FAIRFIELD 
HOSPICE, DONNA A. 
WALTERS, GERI
MALONEY, BRYNN 
RANSLEY, PATRICIA 
HOGAN, and JOANN E. 
DAVEY, as Defendants.

The nature of said suit be­

ing substantially as follows, to 
wit:

Such suit is an Application 
for the Appointment of a Re­
ceiver to execute Ratifications 
of the effective Oil and Gas 
Leases covering the undivided 
non-participating realty inter­
ests owned by Defendants in 
the following-described tract of 
land situated in Borden County, 
Texas, to wit:

All of Section No. 519, in 
Block No. 97, of the H&TC Ry. 
Co. Survey, Borden County, 
Texas, containing 644 acres, 
more or less.

If this Citation is not served 
within ninety (90) days after the 
date of its issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved.

ISSUED this the 15* day of 
October, 2013.

GIVEN UNDER MY 
HAND and seal of said Court, 
at office in Texas, this the 15* 
day of October. 2013.

Joyce Herridge
DISTRICT CLERK, 132nd 

JUDICIAL
DISTRICT COURT OF 

BORDEN COUNTY, TEXAS
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Texas Stories
A Showcase of the Texas Spirit 

Tumbleweed Smith

Anthony Catches a Thief
Anthony Kusenberger has 

lived in Del Rio all his life with 
the exception of six and a half 
years he spent at A & M. He 
liked it there and developed 
some unique studying skills. 
“You know some people go the 
library to study, but real men 
go to the Dixie Chicken to 
study. It takes real talent to try 
to study your physics home­
work while playing dominoes 
and drinking a beer. That’s real 
talent. Anybody can go to the 
library.”

He really wanted to stay at 
A & M. but something made 
him think it was time to 
go.“One day my mother called 
and she said that little Ann 
Strohman would be coming up 
here next year. Well, I used to 
baby-sit this girl. I thought it 
was time for me to get out of 
here.”He ended up with a 
master’s degree in Agricultural 
Economics.

“I thought it would increase 
my social standing if I had an 
advanced degree. My daddy, 
who’s a CPA, told me study­
ing agricultural economics is 
for people who were goofing 
around too much to make it in 
the business school. I agreed 
with him.”

Anthony is known for his 
practical jokes. He learned a lot 
of them at A & M, like cover­
ing the toilet bowl with cello­
phane or painting the toilet seat 
with white shoe polish or 
throwing ice water on someone 
in the shower. Once Anthony 
helped catch a thief who had 
stolen two cordless drills from 
a hardware store in Del Rio.

“I went in the store to buy 
one screw driver. As I was

walking toward the store I saw 
a man run out the front door 
with some employees of 
Russell Hardware run after 
him. A friend of mine grabbed 
the back of my shirt and said, 
‘go get him.’ I chased this guy 
for the equivalent of four 
blocks. He went around the 
wool house one way and I 
knew he was going to be com­
ing around the other way. Sol 
ran through the wool house and 
cut him off. Sure enough, by 
the time I got to the back of the 
wool house, I was waiting for 
him and tackled him. I recov­
ered the stolen drills.

“After this happened I went 
back over to Russell Hardware. 
The owner was there and 
thanked me profusely for get­
ting his merchandise back. I 
thought to myself that these 
people are grateful. I saw a nice 
wrench set for forty-five bucks. 
I thought I would seize the op­
portunity and said to myself, ‘if 
I take this forty-five dollar 
wrench set up to the check 
stand they’re gonna give it to 
me to show their appreciation. ’
I took the forty-five dollar 
wrench set up there and again 
got tons of praise and gratitude 
for catching the thief. The clerk 
told me, ‘that’ll be forty-eight 
ninety five.’ I pulled out my 
credit card and paid for the 
wrenches. Next morning I took 
the wrenches back, got a re­
fund and got my screwdriver.”

Tumbleweed Smith o f Big 
Spring is a folklorist, humor­
ist, after dinner speaker and 
producer o f THE SOUND OF 
TEXAS radio series. Contact 
him at
ts@tumbleweedsmith. com

COMMUNITY BANK OF

Snyderm

325) 573-2681
1715 25th Street

Snyder, Texas 79549 
www.cbankofsnyder.com

Pups Get Win Against Wildcats...
(Continued from Pg. 6)

and returned it 24 yards to the 
11 yard line. On the first play 
Willbom sprinted in and with 
a Payton Merket point after 
run the Pups were in complete 
control at 41 to 6. The Wild­
cats returned the ensuing kick­
off to make the score 47-13.

Borden County got the ball 
to start the second half and on 
the first play of the half Nick 
proulx took a nice fake dive, 
pitch from Richey and sprinted 
33 yards to the end zone and 
with the Merket to Addison 
combination for the point af­
ter the Pups had a 54-13 lead. 
After both teams traded pos­

sessions the second team of­
fense was able to overcome the 
constant stunting by the Wild­
cats and with a play action pass 
the Pups ended the game due 
to the mercy rule as Payton 
Merket hit Thomas Nix with a 
18 yard touchdown pass play 
and a JW run for the point af­
ter and the Pups had a 61 to 14 
victory.

In order to get the kids more 
playing time the two teams fin­
ished the 3rd quarter and all of 
the 4th quarter. In that quarter 
and a half the Pups second 
team outscored the visiting 
w ildcats 7-0 as JW Nix

rumbled in from 24 yards out 
and then Lukas Grantham 
added the point after for a 7-0 
victory in the added time. With 
the victory, the Pups set up a 
district championship matchup 
with the O’Donnell Eagles. 
The Pups will travel to 
O’Donnell to end the 2013 
season and hopefully 
another per­
fect season 
w h i c h  
w o u l d  
mean an- j*  a  
other dis- 9  *
*-Uc 11 * #title.

The Lights for Gail Committee 
cordially invites you to...

The Twentieth Annual Lighting of the Star on Gail Mountain

Borden County Museum, Courthouse and Courtyard
Gail, Texas

Friday, November 29, 2013 (day after Thanksgiving)

The Courthouse and Museum will open at S: 30 p,m, 
for viewing reminiscing, fellowship and refreshments

Santa Claus will be available to visit with the children
(Please bring your own camera for this photo opportunity.)

Join us for Christmas Music provided by local musicians, 
storytime for children, hayrides, ornament contest and door prizes!

EVERYONE IS WELCOME!!!!!
We look forw ard to seeing you  and you r fam ily there!

Drop Off for "Christmas for Kids* (Buckner Children’s Home) will be in the 
Borden County? Courthouse again this year,

Toys and gilts must be dropped off by December 10^,
Children's ages; Newborn - 18 years

i  > T  j .  V h f v

For more information, please e-mail us atll^jfQg2ili>ya.h.QQ,mm..
Be sure to check out our Facebook page; lighting o f the Star on Gail Mountain).

http://www.cbankofsnyder.com
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Coyote JV Win One, Lose One...
(Continued from Pg. 3)

very tough challenge for the 
host Borden County JV squad 
as the visiting Grady Wildcats 
came ready to play. The night 
started out wrong for the Coy­
otes as they were unable to 
move the ball with the first 
possession as they went 4 and 
out. Grady wasted no time as 
they took their first possession 
and drove the ball down until 
they scored on a 24 yard pass 
into the end zone and were able 
to kick the PAT good. The next 
possession was equally tough 
for the Coyotes as they went 3 
and a punt on this one. Grady 
took the punt and returned it 
43 yards for the score, but fail­
ing to convert on the PAT. The 
Coyotes made good on the next 
series as they drove the ball 
down the field and scored on a 
3 yard pass from Kace Lott to 
Dylan Murphy with the PAT 
failing. Grady also took ad­
vantage of the next possession 
and scored on an 18 yard run

but missing the PAT. The score 
stood at 6-20. Borden County 
went 4 and out again on the 
next possession, with Grady 
doing the same. This gave the 
ball back to the Borden County 
offense who took advantage. 
Nathan Souder was able to 
break loose from 17 yards out 
to increase the score to 12. 
Grady took the kickoff and set 
themselves up with good field 
position and capitalized on a 
37 yard strike to score with the 
PAT failing.

Grady put the game out of 
reach as they scored on their 
next 3 possessions on passes 
from 27 and 28 yards out and 
a run from 4 yards out. Borden 
was only able to answer back 
with one score that came from 
Nathan Souder and a run of 54 
yards to make the final score 
18-46. Souder finished the 
night with 5 tackles and 121 
yards rushing with 2 TD’s. 
Robert Jordan had 24 yards

passing and 7 tackles. Kace 
Lott had 25 yards passing and 
4 tackles, Dylan Murphy had 
4 tackles, Braxton Coor had 6 
tackles. Diego Bernal had 9 
tackles. Hunter Huse finished 
the night with 4 tackles as well.

THANK
YOU
FOR

READING
THE

BORDEN
STAR JV  quarterback, Robert Jordan looks for an open teammate to throw a 

pass to and score for the Coyotes.

N O V E M B E R  2 0 1 3
"District Gama

Sunday Monday T  uesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday

.

1
Coyotes @  Grady, 7:30*

2
Regional Cross 
Country @  
Lubbock

-

3
Fall back to 
Standard Time

4 $
F f  A Lone Wolf District 
Leadership Contest- 
W TC, 3 00

6
JH/JY Football @  
O'Donnell 5:30/7:00

8
End of 2nd Six Weeks

HOMECOMING
Pep Rally 5:00 
Sr. Supper after Pep Rally 
Coyotes vs, O'Donnell 
7:30*

9
WTAMO Debate @  
Canyon

-

10 11
Beginning of Six 
Weeks

Elementary/JH 
Academic UlL <§> Grady

12
Elementary/JH 
Academic UlL @  
Grady

88 @  Ropes, 4:00 
gGtoS

13 14 15 16
BB m  ka, 1:00 gG

17 IS
JH 88 @! Gradÿ“8:00;

19
88 vs, Garden City 

4:00 gGfoB

20 21
BB %  Westbrook 
Tourney-GyhB

A,-j&GO
88 @  Westbrook 
Touroey-G.bS

23
BB @  Westbrook 

j  Toumey-G/bB

Area 11 FFA 
Leadership Contest 
(Howard College,. 
Big Spring)

| 24 25
JH BB @  Klondike-TBA PROGRESS REPORTS

Early Release @  12:30

88 @  Midessa-3:00, 
GB

Thanksgiving Holidays i  Thanksgiving Holidays Thanksgiving Holidays 

Lighting of the Gail Star


