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WEATHER
M a y l -  68 48
May 2 -  71 50
May 3 -  78 44
May 4 -  45 32
May 5 -  63 32
Moisture received -- May 
I-- .33 and May 3 -- .02. 
Total rainfall to date 
4.16.
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Local PTA 
Wins Prize 
For Book
A superior rating was 

awarded to the Muleshoe 
Elementary PTA for an 
outstanding publicity book 
at the South Plains Con­
ference at the Lubbock 
Hilton Inn on April 27.

Deborah Noble and Rhon­
da Pummill were awarded 
with district certificates for 
their work on the book. 
Karen Black, Sandi Chit­
wood and Anita Allgood 
also assisted with the 
book.

This is the first time in 
the history of the Mule­
shoe PTA to receive this 
honor.

The publicity book will be 
displayed for one week at 
Mary DeShazo Elementary 
School followed by one 
week at Richland Hills 
Elementary.  It will then be 
presented to Gail Dale, 
retiring president of PTA.

The book consists of pic­
tures of the elementary 
school teachers,  e lemen­
tary school staffs, and 
activities of the Muleshoe 
PTA over the past year.

Cold Weather Leaves 
Frost Friday Morning

Temperature Dips 
To Near Freezing4-H Teams Slated 

For State Contests

SUPERIOR PUBLICITY BOOK.. .Deborah Noble, loft and I h o o d a  Pu b  mill wore
presented with certificates from the 14th school district for a superior award on the 
Muleshoe Elementary PTA Publicity Book. Mrs.  Noble Is the retiring publicity 
chairman of PTA and Mrs.  Pummill assisted with the artwork in the book.

New Restaurant 
Construction Begins

Terry Bouchelle, presi­
dent of the Bailey County 
branch of the American 
Cancer Society, said the 
group will meet at noon 
Tuesday at the Corral Res­
taurant.

He also said new officers 
for the next year will be 
elected during the meet ­
ing.

• • • * •
Three local candidates 

for graduation at Texas 
Tech University during 
spring commencement in­
clude Tom E. Ladd, Rob­
bie L. Nesbitt and Timothy 
J. Sooter.

Graduation exercises will 
be at various locations on 
the Texas Tech campus on 
Saturday, May 12.

Party night for the 
Muleshoe Rotary is sche­
duled for 8 p.m.,  Tuesday, 
May 8, at the Bailey 
County Exhibition Center 
and Coliseum.

Rotary-Anns will be a t ­
tending as guests of their 
Rotarians for this night 
meeting.

• » • • •
Members of the Mule­

shoe Independent  School 
District Board of Trustees 
will meet in Joint session 
with the Muleshoe City 
Council at 8 p.m. on 
Monday. May 7, at the city 
hall.

To be discussed will be 
the local tax structure,  
including exemptions,  
vehicles, total market 
values and the possibilities 
of having a re-evaluation 
program.

Brad Baker, a graduate 
of Muleshoe High School 
and son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jacque Baker, recently 
competed in the Arkansas 
Speech Festival on the 
campus of the University 
of Arkansas at Little Rock.

Of the eight Arkansas 
colleges and universities 
competing in the festival, 
Baker received an ‘excel­
lent’ rating in extempo­
raneous speaking.

In keeping with the herit­
age of this area, Guy and 
Patty Belt will construct a 
new restaurant  adjacent to 
their Ranch House Motel 
at the west edge of Mule-

Cabot Buys 
TUCO,Inc. 
From SPS

Berl Springer,  President 
and Chief Operating Offic­
er of Southwestern Public 
Service Company, an­
nounced that the sale of 
TUCO, Inc. to the Cabot 
Corporation has been 
finalized today. The pur ­
chase price was $33.8 mil­
lion.

TUCO, Inc. was formed 
in May of 1974 as a wholly 
owned subsidiary of South­
western Public Service 
Company to provide 
Southwestern Public Ser­
vice Company with a firm 
supply of fuel, including 
natural gas, coal and fuel 
oil. TUCO, Inc. also pro­
duces other liquid hydro­
carbon by-products for 
sale to non-related whole­
salers.

In announcing the sale, 
Springer said, ‘‘Cabot Cor­
poration is a long estab­
lished individual oil and 
gas company, and the sale 
of TUCO, Inc. to Cabot will 
materially enhance our 
fuel supply and further 
enable us to continually 
provide our customers 
with dependable electric 
service, now and in the 
future” .

Contracts presently held 
by TUCO, Inc. relative to 
fuel supplies to Southwes­
tern Public Service will 
continue and Southwes­
tern Public Service will 
have the first opportunity 
to purchase additional sup­
plies of natural gas re ­
sulting from Cabot explo­
ration activities over a 
broad area.

Cabot Corporation, in ad ­
dition to other business 
activities, explores for, 
develops and produces 
crude oil and natural gas, 
owns gas gathering sys­
tems and operates four 
natural gas processing 
plants for extraction of 
natural gas liquids.

NEW RESTAUIANT PLANNED. ..Tomorrow, Mon­
day, gronndbreaklng la expected for The Capitol 
Freehold Land and Inveatment Cn. Ltd. Reatanrant.  It 
la expected to be completed and open for bas ine ts  by 
Aagnst  15.

shoe.
Belt explained that 

groundbreaking for the 
new construction is expect­
ed Monday,  tomorrow, 
and completion of the facil­
ity is expected between 
August  1 and August  15.

He said the new res tau­
rant will feature a western 
and antique motif and will 
be named The Capitol 
Freehold Land and Invest­
ment Co. Ltd. Restaurant,  
in commemoration of the 
first landholders of all the 
land in Bailey County.

The restaurant  will be 
30x90 feet and will feature 
two dining rooms. The 
main dining room will be 
large enough to accommo­
date most visitors, with a 
30x30 foot dining room on 
the east side for small 
private parties or dinners, 
and for overflow from the 
m ain dining room .

The exterior will be 
reddish - brown, with a full 
length porch and white 
stanchions, in keeping 
with the western theme. 
Inside, it will be finished in 
a weathered wood with 
wood plank carpet. Fea­
tured inside will be anti­
ques of many types. Many 
of which will be placed on 
display with small brass 
name plates showing the 
owner. He explained that 
persons who would like to 
place their antiques on 
display will be given a 
document describing their 
antique or antiques and 
they will be given a docu­
ment describing their an-, 
tique or antiques and they 
will still be owned by the 
person who places them on 
exhibit. He said the an­
tiques will also be fully

Salvation Arm y  
Annual Fund Drive 
Scheduled To Begin

The kick-off meeting of 
the Muleshoe Salvation 
Army Unit 's $1,500 fund 
drive will be at the Bailey 
County Exhibition Center 
and Coliseum at 7:30 a.m. 
on Thursday,  May 10.

Monty Phipps, campaign 
chairman,  said 23 workers 
are ready to solicit gifts, 
but additional workers are 
needed.  " W e  know that 
the people of Muleshoe 
will contribute to this 
emergency fund program 
as they have so generously 
in the pas t ,” Phipps said.

Funds will be used for 
local emergency aid to 
families in need and to 
stranded travelers during 
the fiscal year, he explain­
ed. Other Salvation Army 
services include sending 
boys to summer  camp, 
caring for pre-delinquent 
girls and unwed mothers,  
helping families of prison­
ers and alcoholics, and 
providing relief in natural 
disasters,  added Phipps.

The service unit commit­
tee in Muleshoe include 
Glen Williams, Billye 
Jones,  Dee Clements,  
Roger Albertson, J.D. 
BLack, Frank Ellis, Bill 
Moore and Jeff Peeler.

insured.
In the small dining room, 

the east  wall will be of 
stone, all natural rock, 
with a wood burning fire­
place. The entrance to the 
small dining room will be 
completely of the same 
stone, including the ceiling 
in the hallway.

Wrought  iron gates will 
shut off the small dining 
room to assure privacy for 
the special dinners or par-
Cont. page 6, Col. 3

3-Way School
vjLr «• j

Cheerleaders 
Were Chosen

Last week. West  Texas 
State University cheer ­
leaders chose basketball,  
football and junior high 
school cheerleaders.

Named as basketball 
cheerleaders were DeAun 
Foley, daughter  of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Foley; Jan Simp­
son, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs.  Billy Simpson; Julie 
Carlisle, daughter  of Mr. 
and Mrs.  Nelson Carlisle 
and Belinda Wheeler,  dau ­
ghter of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Wheeler.

Junior high cheerleaders 
chosen include Kimberly 
Autrey, Lori Carlisle, J a n ­
ice Duarte,  DaRene Enos 
and Mychelle Parkman.

Screening 
For Health 
Set Here

A State Health Depar t­
ment team will be screen­
ing needy Bailey County 
children for health prob­
lems on Thursday,  May 
10, according to Cathy 
Greer,  caseworker with the 
Texas Depar tment  of Hu­
man Resources.

According to the case­
worker, the clinic will be 
conducted from 9:30 a.m. 
to 3:30 p.m. at the Texas 
Depar tment  of Health.  306 
West Second, Muleshoe, 
and volunteers are needed 
to supervise small child­
ren whose parents are 
having their siblings re­
ceiving health checkups.

The health screening is 
known as Early and Perio­
dic Screening, Diagnosis 
and Treatment  (EP>SDT). 
Health Department  nurses 
provide the service under 
contract with DHR.

Eligible for the screen­
ing are certified Medicaid 
recipients under the age of 
21. This include recipients 
of Aid to Families with 
Dependent  (AFDC) or 
Supplemental  Security In­
come (SSI). Anyone who is 
eligible for the screening 
and desires it, should con­
tact the local DHR office 
for an appointment.

Those wishing to assist in 
providing transportation to 
and from the clinic, see­
ing after the children or 
furnishing refreshments,  
should contact Patricia 
Mata at the DHR office 
272-3981.

Last weekend,  for the 
first time in history for the 
Bailey County 4-H group, 
both the horse and live­
stock judging teams quali­
fied to compete in the state 
round-up at College Sta­
tion June 5 and 6.

Competing in Extension 
District Two Judging Con­
tests in Lubbock on the 
Texas Tech University 
campus,  eight Bailey 
County 4-H youth became 
eligible for the state com­
petition. Gaines County 
also qualified eight con­
testants,  said Bailey Coun­
ty Extension Agent Spen­
cer Tanksley.
The senior Horse Team 

received second place 
overall and first High Hal­
ter team honors. Also, 
Sharia Farmer was second 
high in halter judging and 
third high as overall 
individual on the judging 
teams. Team members in­
cluded Sharia Farmer,  
Casey Farmer,  Shane 
Claunch and Perry Flow­
ers. Their coaches are Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Farmer.
The senior Livestock 

Judging Team was in se ­
c o n d  place with second 
place team overall; second 
team in beef judging; and 
second team in sheep 
judging.  Jimmy Gleason 
was second high individual 
in beef judging and Alan 
Harrison, third high in 
beef judging.  Team mem­
bers are Jimmy Gleason, 
Alan Harrison, Greg Har­
rison and Kelly Harrison. 
The Livestock Judging 
Team coach is Spencer 
Tanksley.

Placing fifth overall was 
the Senior Rifle Team. 
Team members are Terry 
Shafer, Dana Holmes and

Michael Isaac. Their 
coaches are Jim Shafer 
and John Harris.

Also qualifying for state 
competition was the Junior 
Horse Judging Team. 
They were second place for 
the team in overall com-
Cont. page 6, Col. 3

Like Father, 
Also Like 
Daughter

When yoa think of 
sports flgares,  It lo not 
all that uncommon to 
hear or read of a ton 
following In father’s 
footsteps. Bat,  what 
about following In her 
father’s footsteps,  and 
on a local basis?

This event happened 
late last week when 
Shelly Danham,  a Junior 
at Muleshoe High 
School, went to Austin 
to compete In state 
finals In the discus.

What makes this so 
anlqae Is that 20 years 
ago this month,  her 
father, Jack Dunham,  
was accompanied to 
Austin by former MHS 
Coach Bill Taylor to 
compete on the state 
level In track. And,  do 
you know what the 
event was? That’s right, 
20 years after Jack Dan- 
ham was In the state 
competition for discus, 
his daughter  returned to 
Austin In the same 
event.

Accompanying Shelly 
to Austin were her 
parents and coach.

Bailey County Gets 

Drink Tax Rebate
State Comptroller Bob 

Bullock said Monday that 
Texas cities and counties 
will share more than $5.2 
million in rebates from the

Dr. Charles Lewis 
President-Elect 
Of State Dentists

Last week in Austin, Dr. 
Charles Lewis was named 
president-elect for 1979-80 
for the Te ias  Dental Asso­
ciation. The nomination 
was made during the an­
nual Texas Dental Associa­
tion meeting in Austin.

When Dr. Lewis assumes 
his office, he will be the 
first president  ever elected 
from the Panhandle/South 
Plains area to presidency 
of the state group.

He will be installed as 
president  during the next 
annual meeting.

During the meeting last 
week. Dr. Charles Lewis 
presented his father, Dr. 
A.E. Lewis, with a spe­
cial plaque commemora t­
ing his 50 years in dentis­
try, all of it in Muleshoe.

Dr. Charles Lewis has 
also been in dental prac­
tice in Muleshoe since his 
graduation from dental 
school.

He and his wife, Joan, 
at tended the convention, 
along with Dr. and Mrs. 
A.E. Lewis.

Dr. Lewis is the father of 
three children, Lashelle, 
who is attending Trinity 
College; Lamont, of Hous­
ton and Jeffrey, of the 
horne in Muleshoe.

state’s mixed drink tax.
Bailey County reported 

county tax revenues at 
$2,084.02, and the county 
will receive $312.60 of this 
amount as a rebate.

In Cochran County, the 
reported revenue was 
$637.56 and the county 
received $95.63.

Lamb County’s revenue 
was $7,303.37 and their 
share was $1,095.51, while 
Littlefield reported $4,523. 
57, with their share of the 
tax being $678.54.

Parmer County reported 
no revenue from mixed 
drinks tax.

Bullock said mixed drink 
sales for the first quarter 
of 1979 totaled more than 
$180 million.

His office has mailed 
checks totaling $5.2 mil­
lion to some 200 counties 
and 354 cities as their 
share of the 10 percent 
gross receipts tax on mix­
ed drinks sold in Texas 
during January,  February 
and March of this year.

The balance of the money 
collected, $12.8 million, 
will go to the state 's  
General Revenue Fund.

Texas cities and counties 
receive a 15 percent rebate 
of the tax collected on 
mixed drinks sold within 
their boundaries under the 
law that legalized the sale 
of mixed drinks.

Bullock said mixed drink 
taxes generated $65.3 mil­
lion for state, county and 
local government  in 1978.

The mixed drink tax is 
collected by the Alcoholic 
Beverages Commission 
and the city-county share 
is rebated on a quarterly 
basis by the Comptroller 's 
office.

Shivering residents who 
were hunting coats and 
sweaters Thursday morn­
ing probably forgot that 
the same type weather was 
in this area a year ago to 
the day. On Thursday, 
May 3, of this year, the 
weather was bone chilling 
low 40s with a brisk wind.

But, on Wednesday,  May 
3 of last year, the city had 
received 1.8 inches of rain 
and a light snow was 

‘falling that morning. True, 
the snow did not last long, 
but it lightly dusted the 
ground before it melted.

Small hail also pelted the 
area during the three days 
before the third, again 
much like the weather this 
year. But, last year, a wide 
area was not devastated by 
deep hail that piled up, 
leaving more than three 
inches of rain in a sudden 
cloudburst.

Friday morning was cold­
er yet as the temperature 
dipped into the low 30s 
and persons whose vehic­
les were sitting outside 
had to scrape ice off their 
windshields from the very 
heavy frost shortly after 
sunrise.

Bailey County Agent 
Spencer Tanksley said he 
did not believe the very 
cold temperature was 
enough to seriously da m­
age young growth, al-

MAIF Plans
City Survey
Thursday morning, a 

group met to discuss the 
final draft of the planned 
survey to be conducted in 
M uleshoe.

Coordinating the meet ­
ing was Jeff Smith, pre­
sident of the Muleshoe 
Area Industrial Founda­
tion.

A final draft will be 
prepared by Ken Leggett, 
planner for the South 
Plains Association of 
Governments,  Lubbock, 
and mailed to Smith for 
approval prior to printing 
1,500 to be distributed to 
private homes and 250 for 
businesses in Muleshoe.

Attending the meeting 
were Smith, Leggett, City 
Manager Dave Marr,  City 
Council member  Bob Fin­
ney, manager of Pioneer 
Gas Jess Winn, motel 
owner Guy Belt and Cleta 
Williams of The Journal.

Commissioners 
Buy Trucks 
During Meeting
During a regular monthly 

meeting of the Bailey 
County Commissioners 
Court on Wednesday,  
commissioners approved 
bids for two trucks for 
Precinct One and Two.

For Precinct I, the bid 
was awarded to Muleshoe 
Motor Company. After 
trade-in, the net bid was 
$9,282.76, plus an addi­
tional $396 for the bed of 
the truck.

The bid of Muleshoe 
Motor Company was also 
approved for Precinct II. 
Net bid was $8,782.76, 
plus $396 for the bed of the 
truck.

Meeting with commis­
sioners court was Boyd 
Magby, who requested to 
purchase a parcel of land. 
The request  was tabled for 
further study.

Commissioners also pass­
ed a resolution approving 
the application of funds for 
the district attorney in­
vestigator for the year 
1980 and established the 
county polity of paying 
mileage for travel at 18 
cents. Previously, commis­
sioners paid 16 cents.

They also paid routine 
bills during the day.

though it would slow 
growth and germination of 
seed in the colder soil.

Thursday was dreary with 
the cold wind and a steady 
drizzle that left no accumu­
lation of moisture.

Warmer  temperatures 
and clear skies were ex­
pected to dominate the 
weather picture for the 
weekend as the cold front 
that caused Thursday’s 
miserable weather gained 
in intensity before s lam­
ming into the Dallas - Fort 
Worth area leaving wide­
spread flooding and torna­
does that caused minor 
damage.

National Weather Service 
said the warmer tempera­
ture is expected to linger 
in the area until next 
Tuesday, when cooler 
weather again will be 
noted.

MHS Honor 
Graduates 
Are Named

Late last week, Muleshoe 
High School released 
names of the top gradua t ­
ing students for the 1978- 
79 senior class. Named 
valedictorian was Julia 
Shain, daughter  of Mr. 
and Mrs.  Charles Shain, 
with a 96.9166 four year 
grade point average. La- 
vayne Lloyd, with a 94. 
0877 grade point average 
was named salutatorian. 
She is the daughter  of Mr. 
and Mrs. Duane Lloyd.

Other honor graduates 
are Stephanie Bell, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Bell; Brent Burrows, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Olan 
Burrows; Debbie Hall, 
daughter  of Mr. and Mrs. 
T.R. Hall; Mark Harmon, 
son of Mr. and Mrs.  Don 
Harmon and Shannon 
Kennedy,  daughter  of Mr. 
and Mrs.  Clinton Kenne­
dy.

Also, Cecil Mardis,  son of 
Clifford Mardis and Lea- 
trice Mardis; Jeep Shanks, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Shanks; Karen Sto­
vall, daughter  of Mr. and 
Mrs. David Stovall; Dickey 
Sudduth,  son of Mr. and 
Mrs.  Dave Sudduth and 
Steve Turner,  son of Mr. 
and Mrs.  Royce Turner.

JULIA SHAIN

LAVAYNE LLOYD

/
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Store Hours: 
Open 8:00-9:00 

Monday - Saturday 
Sunday 9:00-8:00

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 
PRICES EFFECTIVE MAY 6-12,1979

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF
WRIGHT S HICKORY 

SMOKED SLICED

OLD SOUTH 
2 LB AVG

BONELESS 
CENTER CUT

Round

HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF boneless

S irlo in  l i p  Steak le

OSCAR MAYER FRANKS AND

Wieners "S53?F
OSCAR MAYER SLICED

CLAUSSEN S SWEET AND

Sour Pickles
OSCAR MAYER SLICED

24 OZ 
JAR

MEAT/BEEF
THICK

★ ★ Double Barrel Specials ★ ★
ZEE ASSORTED

PLASTIC GLAD

Trash BagsSHURFINE IN GLASS

Applesauce
SUNSHINE TASTY

Sugar Wafers
BAM A PANCAKE AND

30* OFF LABEL

Alpo Dog Food

Towels CAT FOOD

JUMBO
ROLL FOR CATS TIDY

Cat litte rALL GRINDS
With Filled BookletFolger's Coffee STAY FREE REG./SUPER

ASSORTED FLAVORS KRAFT
ALLGRINDS

Folger's Coffee EVEREADY HEAVY DUTY D

BatteriesSANDWICH SIZE
Y&=$\W mcui
sSAUtU

EVEREADY HEAVY DUTY C

BatteriesSauce
With Filled BookletALL GRINDS

Coffee
With Filled Booklet

OFF LABEL AUTOMATIC 
I DISHWASHER ■Borden's

*  Buttermilk
FREEZER QUEEN

Cooking°
Bags

Buy 2 Pkgs. Light Bulbs 
At Reg. Price g p  

And 5 Lb. Shurfine [ 5 5

Sugar For 3 9 *1 1

5 OZ. 
PKGS

KRAFT ASSTD. SLICES

Deluxe 
Choice pk

With Filled BookletBorden
Orange

With Filled Booklet Whipped
Parkay

ASSTD. FRUIT FLAVORS

2 8 OZ 
TUBS

KRAFT

Orange
Juice QUART

BTL.

US NO. 1 RUSSET ALL PUCES 
ON SALE! 

COMPLETE YOUR 
SET NOW!

COME TO PAY 'N ’ SAVE 
FOR YOUR W I C 

CARD PURCHASES

JOHNSON'S EDGE

Shave Cel

BRAND
PLASTIC STRIPSGENTLE/REG./OILY 8 0Z. BTL.

Agree Shampoo
AGREE REG./OILY/EX.BODY

Creme Rinse *

WASHINGTON RED DELICIOUS m m c  LONG GREEN SLICERS

45  Cucumbers
30 CT 
PKGLARGE TIECALIFORNIA M  L A H U t  l i t  A  ^  _

Gr**n OniMt 2  for 3 5f Carrots

e x t r a  s p e c i a l  
p r i c e s  f o r

MOTHER S D AYQ U A L I T Y  A N D  S E R V I C E

Spetiab

S H U R FIN E

Pinto Beans 
„ $  1 0 9

20‘ OFF LA B E L

GREEN G IA N T  C U T

Oreen Beans
GREEN G IA N T  W K

16 OZ 
C A N S

12 O Z  
C A N S

D a m j  A n d  F a c d

Health And Beauty Aub
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Jean Stalcup Offered Navajo Program For AARP

CTA OFFICERS.. .Tb* CIi i i n h  Teacher ’* Association elected officer* for I 9 7 M I  
Tuesday afternoon. Pictured, left to right, are Pat Black, parl iamentarian;  Beth 
Sklpworth, treasurer;  Jane Rudd,  secretary; Kerry Moore,  vice prealdent;  Lanelle 
Skaggs, president - elect and Johanna Wrinkle, president.

Calendar
Of

Events

Monday. . .
The Jaycees will meet  at 

12 noon in the Bailey Co. 
Civic Center.

The GRIP will hold their 
weekly meeting at 4 p.m. 
in the Reception Room of 
Tri-County Savings and 
Loan.
T uesday. . .

PTA will take newspapers 
and magazines to Little­
field from 9 a.m. to 12 
p.m. for recycling. The 
money will go to the 
Satellite School in Little­
field.

At noon, the Rotary Club

will meet  in the Bailey 
County Civic Center.

The Muleshoe Art Asso­
ciation will meet at 2 p.m. 
in the Muleshoe State 
Bank Community Room.

A Mother - Daughter  Tea 
will be held at 4:30 p.m. by 
the Christian Woman's 
Fellowship at the First 
Christian Church.

Rebekahs will meet at 
Odd Fellows hall at 7:30 
p . m .

At 7:30 p.m. ,  the Pro­
gress 4-H Club will meet in 
the W est C a m p  Communi­
ty Center.
"The Gymnastic Booster 

Club will hold their month­
ly meeting at 8 ap.m. in 
the 16th and D Church of 
Christ.
W ednesday. . .

The Lion's Club will meet 
at 12 p.m. in the Bailey

Perfect for-

The 

Graduate—

—a gift from 
The Men's Shop.

•Excellent Selection of Clothing 

•Check our gift bar for unusual gifts.

Albertson’s
Shop For Men

228 Main 272-3000

County Civic Center.
The Muleshoe Study Club 

will meet  at 4 p.m. in the 
home of Mrs.  Rufus Gil­
breath.  “ In Ways to Cook 
Ou t"  will be the program 
given by Mrs.  J .G. Arnn. 
This will be the last meet ­
ing for 1978-79.
Thursday. .._

The Optimists will hold 
their weekly meeting at 12 
p.m. in the Bailey County 
Civic Center.

TOPS will meet  at 6 p.m. 
in the Bailey County Elec­
tric Coop Community 
Room.

At 7:30 p.m. ,  the Odd 
Fellows will meet  in Odd 
Fellows Hall.
Friday.. .

The Kiwanis will meet  for 
breakfast  at 6:30 a.m. in 
the Corral Restaurant .

PTA will hold a salad 
luncheon at 11:30 a.m. to 2 
p.m. for PTA officers and 
committee chairmen. 
Saturday.. .

The Muleshoe Singing 
Group will meet  at 7 p.m. 
in the Trinity Baptist 
Church Fellowship Hall.

The Muleshoe chapter of 
A.A.R.P.  (American Asso­
ciation of Retired Persons) 
met in regular session 
Friday, April 27 in the 
Bailey County Civic Center 
under  the supervision of 
Lelah Adams of Lubbock, 
Area State Director. 

Clarence Wilhite, presi-

Linda Marr 
Installed 
C T A  Officers

The Muleshoe chapter of 
Texas Classroom Teachers 
Association met Tuesday, 
May 1 in the Junior High 
Library to install officers 
for 1979-80.

President  Linda Marr  in­
stalled the incoming of­
ficers using colors to sym­
bolize the duties of each 
office. Installed were, Pre­
sident, Johanna Wrinkle; 
president  - elect, LaNelle 
Skaggs; vice president,  
Kerry Moore; Secretary, 
Jane  Rudd; treasurer,  
Beth Skipworth and parlia­
mentarian,  Pat Black. 

Johanna  Wrinkle pre­
sented Linda Marr  with a 
retiring Presidents '  pin.

A short business meeting 
followed. Lucy Faye Smith 
gave a legislative report. 
She presented the current 
standing on all Education 
bills at the present  time in 
Austin.

Brent Burrows was 
selected as the recipient of 
the 1979-80 T.C.T.A. 
Scholarship Award. He 
will be a 1979 graduate of 
Muleshoe High School and 
is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Olan Burrows. He plans to 
attend Texas Tech or West 
Texas State University.

dent,  called the meeting to 
order. F.H. (Shorty) Davis 
gave the invocation.

Luncheon was served and 
routine business was 
transacted. Mrs.  Adams 
led the Pledge of Allegi­
ance. Minutes of the pre­
vious meeting were read 
by Clara Lou Jones,  Secre­
tary and Faye Lambert 
gave the t reasurer ’s re ­
port.

Mrs. Adams introduced 
Jean Sliter Stalcup of Lub­
bock, a retired teacher of 
the Navajo Indian School 
in Kayenta,  Ariz. who 
brought the program on 
“ Teaching the Navajos".  
Identification badges were 
passed out with the in­
scription “ YA AT E E H ” , 
meaning “ hello, How are 
you?” Many hand made 
articles were on display 
including beads made 
from olive seeds,  rugs,  a 
loom, wedding basket and 
other items.

Clara Lou Jones read the 
Indian’s version of the 
23rd Psalm. Mrs. Stalcup 
showed slides and nar ra t­
ed the scenes and gave 

* information regarding 
each. Viewed on the slides 
were the deep well in 
Kayenta,  Ariz.; Indian ho- 
gans, Monument  Valley, 
Utah; Mount Humphries;  
Dr. Annie Wauneka;  Skip 
rock; Tanning of hides, El 
Capital and Yeibichei (Ya- 
bi-shay). She also passed 
out programs,  giving the 
English meaning of Indian 
words. She played a tape 
of the Navajo Riding Song

RETIRING PRESIDE NT.. .Jab anna Wrinkle, CTA Pre­
sident for 1979-80 presented Linda Marr,  left, with a 
pin as retiring President  of the Classroom Teacher ' s
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Johnson’s Says

“Down With Mother”
Sit Her Down!
Slow Her Down!
Calm Her Down!

With A Throne Of Her 
Own!

What A 
To Say 

You 
on

Her Special Day 

With A Lazy-Boy 

Recliner!

Johnson Furniture
2104 * .*■•! .  Ilvd. Muleshoe 272-4315
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and the Navajo Prayer, 
“ Great  Sprit, Grant that I 
may not criticize my neigh­
bor until I have walked a 
mile in his moccasins.”

Zed Robinson gave the 
benediction.

Breast Cancer 
Program Given 

For Study Club
The Muleshoe Study Club 

viewed a film on breast  
cancer on April 26 in the 
home of Beatrice Black­
burn with Mildred Neely 
serving as hostess.
Howard Watson presented 
the film and Francene 
Wenmohs showed the film 
and made comments on 
the importance of extreme 
care being exercised in 
examinations and also in 
doctor visits. «

Members  present  were 
Blanche Johnson,  Sena 
Stevens,  Vivian White, 
Fern Gilbreath, Alma 
Turner,  Joylene Costen, 
Charlene Bartholf, Mild­
red Neely, Beatrice Black­
burn,  Wilma Thompson,  
Mae Wilterding, Betty 
Carpenter ,  Izetta Shain 
and Levina Pitts.

Refreshments of fruit piz­
za, tea and coffee were 
served. The center piece 
was a plate of crocheted 
posies made by Mrs. Neely 
and each member  was 
presented one of these as 
they were served.

Attending the meeting 
were Mr. and Mrs. Clar­
ence Wilhite, Mary Smith, 
Mrs. Ottice Wyer, Lelah 
Adams, Iva Smith, Mrs. 
Leonard Evans,  Jean Sliter 
Stalcup, Gertrude Allen, 
Mr. and Mrs.  A.F. Lam­
bert, D.W. Marlow, Mr. 
and Mrs. Zed Robinson, 
Mr. and Mrs.  A.R. Mc­
Daniel, Mr. and Mrs. Matt  
Dudley, Mr. and Mrs.
John Gunter,  Mr. and 
Mrs.  Doc Goucher,  Mr. 
and Mrs. Owen Jones,  Mr. 
and Mrs. F.H. Davis, Mr. 
and Mrs. B.H. Bickel, Mr. 
and Mrs.  M.H. Laney, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jesse Pruitt, Mr. 
and Mrs. Floyd Ruthardt,  
A.F. Robertson, Mary 
Whitson, Jewell McNabb 
and Mary Farley.

A.A.R.P. meets the 
fourth Friday of each 
month at 11:3V a.m. in the 
Bailey County Civic Cen­
ter. They invite all per ­
sons SS years of age and 
over to bring a covered 
dish and attend these 
meetings.

* * * * *
Exercise or physical ac­

tivity helps to promote an 
overall sense of well • 
being. Apart  from just 
making you feel good, 
exercise can have real 
physical benefits.  It can 
help to control blood pres ­
sure and may strengthen 
and perhaps increase the 
number of blood vessels 
around the heart,  thus 
lowering the risk of coro­
nary heart  disease.  Exer­
cise can also increase the 
capacity of the lungs.

• • • • •
Closely related to exer ­

cise in most people’s 
minds is diet. Often be­
liefs about diet relative to 
physical activity are inac­
curate or misleading. A 
moderate increase in acti­
vity level does not neces­
sitate a change in eating 
habits -- that is, if your diet 
is already balanced. A 
well-balanced diet should 
include a wide variety of 
foods to ensure an ade­
quate intake of all essen­
tial nutrients.  Being phy­
sically active does not re­
quire special dietary sup­
plements of any kind.
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Original Designing 
Custom Fit Jeans 
Boutique Clothing
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T «  M  520.00 qWif JJlctlm Day. 
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109 S. 1st 
Muleshoe 
272-5180

Hours:
9:00  To 5:00
Now Open On 

Saturday

Monday

Tuesday & Wednesday

Ladies Canvas Shoes
★  Lace Styles By Osaga
★  Washable-Assorted Styles

Regular S I4.00

$ Q O O
Regular $19.00

* 1 2 ° °
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ -

Pom-Pom Socks
★  White, Ass’t Pom-Pom
★  Size 5/6 - 7 l m  - 9/11
★  Regular SI.50

3/*3°°
-SSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSS

100% Polyester

Men’s Suits
★  Size 36-48
★  3 Pc. or 4 Pc. Suits
★  Solid Colors
★  Regular 

SI 45.00
B $$ !

Junior Styled

Pants—Blouses
★  Straight Leg
★  Fashion Pant

Printed T-Shirts
★  Solid Color-Crew Neck
★  Size S-M-L-XL
★  50/50 Blend

Boys Men’s
$  O  0 0  B / l  0 0  D e c a |

o  Free
•$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ >

Wrangler Jeans
★  Cowboy Cut
★  100%-Cotton-14 Oz. Denim
★  Sizes-32 to 36
★  Reg.

S12.98 $  1  A 0 0

$$$$$$$$$$$$$$$$$$. 
Special Group
Knit Shirts

★  2 Ply 100% Cotton
★  Solids & Stripes
★  Placket Fronts

★  Reg. SI 5.00- 
S 16.00 *1000

Regular 
$28.00 

SSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSS-
*1900

.SSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSS,
Junior Styled to

Pants—Skirts
★  Sizes 3-15
★  Solid Colors

r , s . s , 5 . ; )P o • " , F r * o , , o ;

$ ] 7 o o$ 1 2 °°
_ _ _ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

Ladies Accessories
★  Jewelry
★  Scarves
★  Belts 1 / 2

110 Main St. ClaM
Price O ®

272-4453
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INSTALLED IN EPSILON DELTA...Rituals were held May 1 te Inatall new member* 
In Eptllon Delta. They are,  plctnred left to right, front row, Rita Lane, Nelcy 
Burleson and Vearly Blggerstaff; back row, Louvenla Garllngton and Suzan Wheeler.  
Not pictured la Cyathla Neble aad Connie Thema*.

EPSILON DELTA OFFICERS.. .Epallon Delta of ESA Installed officers for 1979-80 on 
May 1. Officers are,  pictured left to right, Beverly Kimbrough,  president; Jan 
Crawford, vice-president; Virginia Bowers, secretary; Sherry Barrett,  t reasurer;  and 
Pat Young, educational director. Not pictured Is Judy Lambert,  awards chairman.

Officers Installed
Pat Young, President,  

read the opening ritual of 
Epsilon Delta, chapter of 
Epsilon Sigma Alpha, on 
Tuesday, May 1 in the 
home of Rita Lane. Co­
hostesses were Beverly 
Kimbrough and Suzan 
W heeler.

Mrs. Young conducted 
the business meeting and 
Diana Harrison, chaplain, 
led the prayer. The

LATEST O  
ARRIVALS

Larry Don Tliomas
Larry Don Thomas was 

born to DPS Trooper and 
Mrs. Don Thomas,  former­
ly of Muleshoe. They now 
reside at 1505 Ennis St., 
Plainview. Larry Don was 
born at 3:05 a.m . on M ay 3 
at Health Sciences Cen­
ter Hospital in Lubbock 
and weighed six pounds, 
13 ounces.
Grandparents are Mr. 

and Mrs. Spud Thomas, 
Lubbock and Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Crowell, Hobbs, 
N .M . Great - grandparents 
are Mrs. Rose Crowell, 
Wichita Falls and Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Thomas. Mule- 
shoe.

For Epsilon Delta
minutes were read by Vir­
ginia Bowers in the ab­
sence of the secretary, 
Judy Lambert.

The officers and commit­
tee chairmen gave their 
reports.  Elaine Burgess 
announced the birthdays 
and anniversaries for May.

Beverly Kimbrough and 
Diana Harrison each re ­
ceived ESA baby spoons as 
gifts for their newborn 
babies.

The various committees 
gave their reports on the 
Mother-Daughter Banquet 
to be held on May 12 at 
11:30 a.m. in the 16th and 
Avenue D Church of 

* * * * *

Bradley Keith Jones
Mr. and Mrs. Roger 

Jones of Nocona are the 
proud parents of a new 
baby boy born April 18. 
Bradley Keith weight 
eight pounds and was 20 
inches long.

His grandparents are 
Mrs. Lorello Jones of 
Enochs and Mr. and Mrs. 
Neely Archie of Rotan.

Christ.
Diana Harrison installed 

the new officers for 1979- 
80. They are, president, 
Beverly Kimbrough; vice- 
president,  Jan Crawford; 
secretary, Virginia Bow­
ers; Sherry Barrett,  t rea­
surer; Awards Chairman, 
Judy Lambert and Educa­
tional Director, Pat Young.

Mrs. Kimbrough an­
nounced her committee 
chairman for 1979-80.

Pat Young, president for 
1978-79, gave each of her 
officers a gift to show her 
appreciation. The candle 
was passed in which Char ­
lene Gregory announced 
the adoption of a daugh­
ter.

The hostesses served re­
freshments of sausage 
balls, fresh fruits and 
vegetables and homemade 
cinnamon rolls to Sherry 
Barrett,  Jo Blackwell, Vir­
ginia Bowers, Elaine Bur­
gess, Jan Crawford, Char­
lene Gregory, Diana Har­
rison, Judy Lambert,  Mag- 
ann Rennets,  Pat Young, 
Vearly Biggerstaff, Niecy 
Burleson, Louvenia Gar- 
lington and Sharon Mont­
gomery.

ALL TH E  H E A T G O E S  IN T O  TH E FO O D . 
N O N E  IS W A S T E D '

SAVE 50°/o - 7 5 %  of the  E lectric ity  
N orm ally  used in C ooking*

M I C R O W A V I  f O V E N

made only by l 4 m a n a

•  Cook most foods in 14 the normal time
•  Cook a roast in 45 minutes, baked potato in 4 minutes, 

hamburger in just 1 minute
•  No pots to scrub No messy oven to clean En;oy fast. easy, 

carefree cooking every time

Model RR-7D
•  Amana COOKMATIC Power 

ShiftTM puts you in full control 
of everything you cook

• 2 Automatic Timer Controls
• Start Switch
•  Stop Switch
•  Pull down see-through door
• Oven Light Switch
• Cooking Indicator Dial Light
• Buzzer with on/off Switch
•  Removable Oven Tray

lOO

'Comparison test figures were 
made by leading West Coast 
and Mid-West utilities and 
Amana Ann MacGregor Test 
Kitchen using the appropriate 
conventional cooking in an 
electric oven, range top or elec­
tric fry pan

•3 9 9
Just In Time

For Mother’s Day
We Have Amana Microwave Ovens 

Starting As Low As 
s l8 8 00

HMHMKS
122 S. lit. 272-3030

Mae Provence Recognized 
As Long Standing KOPS

Six women of the Mule- 
shoe TOPS Club attended 
the North West  Texas 
Area Recognition Days 
held in the Abilene Civic 
Center  on April 27 and 28. 
Those attending were Mae 
Provence, Lauranette Ma ­
son, Ann Vinson, Rose 
Sain, Sue Murphy and 
Evelene Harris.

Mrs.  Provence was recog­
nized as a long standing 
KOPS of 15 years.  For this

honor she received an 
emerald and diamond 
necklace. She had previ­
ously received a ruby drop 
for five years and a sap­
phire drop for ten years of 
Keeping Off Pounds Sen­
sibly. Only one other 
woman in this district has 
maintained a 15 year 
status,  that being Helen 
Rogers of Lubbock, who 
helped organize Muleshoe 
TOPS 16 years ago.

LONG STANDING KOPS. . .Mae Provence was recog­
nized as a Long Standing KOPS of 15 years at the 
Northwest Texas Area Recognition Days held In 
Abilene. Mrs. Provence was presented with a diamond 
and emerald necklace.

I TOPS Hat I
IlF eekly Meeting j
i

The TOPS Club was call­
ed to order by Clara Lou 
Jones,  leader, on May 3 at 
6 p.m. in the Community 
Room of Bailey County 
Electric Cooperative. The 
TOPS pledge was recited 
and the group sang the 
TOPS song.

Evelene Harris gave roll 
call with 23 members 
weighing in.

Vickie Garner was crown­
ed the weekly queen with 
Zeffa Shafer as first runner 
up. Second runner up was
Dovie K nowles.

Monthly queen was Linda 
Vinson with first runner 
up, Brenda Murphy and

second runner up. Vickie 
Garner.

Linda Vinson received 
material for three weeks of 
consecutive weight loss
and Dana Arnold celebrat­
ed her birthday.

The meeting was dismiss­
ed with the Goodnight 
Song.

Don't Forget Your 
Mother Or Sweetheart 

On Mother's Day

Ladies Jeans, Tops And 

Suits Western Or ISon-Western

Free Gift 
Wrap

Open Mon.-Sat. 9 a.m.-6 p.m.

3 P

WESTERN WEAR

1910W.Amer.Blvd. 272-4663

i i T t s b o i v

Mrs. Mason was recog­
nized as a two year KOPS 
of long standing.

There were 47 chapters 
represented and 35 leaders 
were present .  The number  
of persons attending were 
355 from the Northwest 
Texas area.

There were 75 long s tand­
ing KOPS honored as they 
crossed the Hawaiian Is­
land stage and presented a 
lei, as their KOPS status 
and pounds lost were re ­
vealed.

This was followed with 
the graduation of 11 
KOPS, four runners up 
and the queen of the 
Northwest TOPS area,
Janie Gibson of Dyess Air 
Force Base.

The program was con­
cluded with KOPS of long 
standing,  dressed in white
gowns, holding flash­
lights, encircling their
TOPS sisters as the dome 
lights faded and the song, 
•‘You’ll Never Walk 
Alone" was sung by a 
male vocalist.

4!WIFE
Women Involved

In fo rm  tconom lc/

Texas WIFE had their 
monthly statewide meet ­
ing in Plainview on April 
21 and drew the names of 
three women in the Home 
Beautiful Treasure Chest 
Raffle. Th-e .winners were 
Janice McClain of Perry- 
ton, Mrs. Don Brown of 
Hale Center and Jean 
Baker of Stratford.

As a money maker, the 
club considered the project 
a success. Local business­
es who donated merchan­
dise were Cobb’s, Some­
thing Special, Higginboth- 
am-Bartlett ,  St. Clairs and 
C.R. Anthony's.

Several WIFE members 
met Tuesday, May 1 for a 
‘brown bag'  lunch and 
letter writing session to 
the legislature in Austin.

AI Brown, chairman of 
the constitutional am end­
ment committee was con­
tacted by WIFE to encour­
age him to favorably and 
quickly report the Family 
Farm Security Act (S.J.R. 
13). If this bill is passed,  it 
will allow beginning farm­
ers to obtain loans to 
purchase farm property.

Letters were also sent to 
Bob Price and Bill Clay­
ton, asking them to sup­
port HB2205, introduced 
by Bob Simpson to create a 
master water district made 
up of all Texas regional 
districts combined and 
having the authority to join 
with other states to begin 
negotiations for water. 
This bill is now in the 
House National Resources 
Committee and hearings 
will begin May 2.

The President of Texas 
WIFE, June Saylor of 
Muleshoe has received the 
singular honor of being 
appointed to Agricultural 
Issues Committee,  an ad­
visory to the State Demo­
cratic Executive Commit­
tee on matters pertaining 
to Texans involved in pro­
duction of food and fiber. 
The appointment was 
made by Bill Goldbert,  
chairman of the Democra­
tic party of Texas.

COUPLE TO WED.. .Mrs .  Betty Buach of Lubbock anti
Mr. and Mrs. J.L. Blaylock of Muleshoe wish to 
announce the engagement  and approaching marriage 
of their children, Barbara Ann Busch to Danny Lynn 
Blaylock. The couple plan to marry May 27 In the home 
of the groom's parents.  Miss Busch Is employed at the 
Methodist  Hospital In Lubbock. Blaylock Is a 1973 
graduate of Muleshoe High School and attended 
Commercial College at Lubbock. He Is employed at 
Edward’s Electronics, Inc. In Lubbock.

Independence is not al­
ways a virtue.

Triumph of wrong is 
never final victory.

Sign Up For Summer 

Classes... NOW!
Boys & Girls 3 Yrs. Old & Up 

Classes Begin June 4th 
Gymnastics Classes

(wirls: Floor Exercise, Balance Beams, 
Uneven Parallel Bars, & Vault Acrobats.

Boys: Floor Exercise, Acrobats Pommel, 
Horse, Horizontal Bar.

Dance Classes:
Ballet. Jazz, Tap, Character, Modem, 

Ballet For Gymnasts.

Ladies Exercise Classes:
Mon. & Thurs., Morning & Evening Classes

Instructors:
Cindy Purdy,

Sheri Hawkins, 
&

Waldo Casarez
Enroll Now!

ClasseN Limited!

School Of Dance
& Gymnastics

219 E. Ave. B 
272-3483 or 272-4017

Round The Clock, one of the greot nomes in 
fashion hosiery, has joined our rocks Experience 
the fit, the feel and the fashion of truly luxuri­
ous panty hose

50-NUDE N NAUGHTY PANTYHOSE 
All sheer sandaifoo t 2 50

And the Givenchy Collection for Round-The- 
Clock

565 GIVENCHY BODY SMOOTHERS 
7C denier Lye 'a Spandex support 
pantyhose All shee' sandaifoo t 5 95

Fashion Hosiery Dept. 
321 Main 

Muleshoe, Texas
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321 Main 
Muleshoe, Texas

"Twi-Niters" Beautiful Feminine Lingerie— A Very Special Gift For Her
An embroidered floral applique enhances the beauty of this elegant ensemble of lustrous nylon. 
Available in soft shades of Spearmint or Light 8lue Cloud

Short Gown S-M-L $10. Long Gown S-M-L $13.
Short Gown X L $11. Long Robe S-M-L $19.
Short Robe S-M-L $16. Pajama Sizes 32-40 $16.
Short Robe XL $17.

Bailey County Journal, Sunday May u, 1979, Page 5

Cosmetics

^wiuhj Ootisiftrmf

rTw (lowpftmfntflty rfririnP 2008 'tJintowaij rJpAVior

^ e m e m b e /t  ( j M o t o s  ^ a i j  

QAM lA Q $

^/lom —-

l a t r e l l  s  f a s h

Eastern Stars To Install New Officers

Antique Sho & Sale

New Officers 

Elected For 

Xi Omicron Xi
The Xi Omicron Xi Chap­

ter of Beta Sigma Phi met 
in the home of Rhonda 
Pummill  on Tuesday even­
ing, May 1. Six mem­
bers received the rituals of 
the Exempler Degree.  
They were Vicki Black, 
Debbie Foster, Rhonda 
Little, Linda Marr,  Lir.dy 
Schuster and Gayla 0
Toombs.

The installation of offic­
ers for 1979-80 was con­
ducted by Pam Miller 
Installed as officers were, 
President ,  Barbara Fin­
ney; Vice President,  Judy 
Wilbanks; Recording Sec­
retary, Lynne Box; Trea­
surer,  Margie Merrit t  and 
Corresponding Secretary,

Women's C Of C 

Plans Annual 
Slaton A rt Show

The Wom en’s Division of 
the Slaton Chamber of 
Commerce will sponsor the 
ninth annual Slaton Art 
Show on May 12 in the 
Slaton’s Lubbock County 
Club House at 750 W. 
Garza in Slaton.

The exhibition will be 
open to the public May 12 
from 1 to 4:30 p.m. Paint­
ings and drawings in all 
medium and sculpture will 
be accepted but may not 
exceed 75 pounds. Duward 
Campbell  of Lubbock will 
judge the show.

Entries will be received at 
the Club House, Slaton, on 
May 11 from 6 to 8 p.m. 
and on Saturday, May 12 
from 8 to 11 a.m. No 
entries will be accepted 
after 11 a.m. The Club 
House will be closed from 
11 a.m. to 1 p.m. for 
judging.  A fee of 13 per 
entry will be charged and a 
20% commission will be 
charged on all sales.

Awards will be present ­
ed at 4 p.m. on Saturday. 
Cash awards will be pre­
sented from Slaton Mer­
chants along with Pur ­
chase Prized. Ribbons will 
be given in each division.

All work must be original 
and not previously exhibit­
ed in Slaton. Pictures and |  
drawings must be securely.- 
wired for hanging. Any 
works not in good taste 
may be rejected by the 
committee.

For further information, 
contact Pat Moses at 828 • 
5383, Ada May Robinson 
at 828-6304 or the Cham­
ber of Commerce at 828- 
6238.

Sandi Chitwood.
Following the installation 

and rituals, a covered dish 
meal was served in honor 
of the new members.

During the business 
meeting,  presided over by 
Mrs. Finney, the new bud­
get was adopted and com­
mittee assignments were 
made for the next year. 
Committee reports were 
given and plans and dates 
for future activities were 
discussed.

The annual  Mother ’s Day 
luncheon will be held on 
May 12 at the Methodist  
Church. The two local 
chapters of Beta Sigma Phi 
will honor a local women 
during the luncheon.

Members  attending the 
meeting were Karen (Clif­
ford) Black, Karen (Tom­
my) Black, Lynne Box, 
Sandi Chitwood, Rhonda 
Finney, Margie Merritt ,  
Pam Miller, Rhonda Pum ­
mill, Jo Rempe,  Doris 
Scoggin, Lucy Faye Smith, 
Francene Wenmohs,  Judy 
Wilbanks,  Vicki Black, 
Debbie Foster, Rhonda 
Little, Linda Marr,  Lindy 
Schuster and Gayla
Toombs.

Alpha Zeta Pi 
Held Rituals For 
New Members
Cindy Purdy, vice - presi­

dent,  called Alpha Zeta Pi 
to order in her home 
Tuesday at 7:30 p.m. Kar- 
ren Renner and Vickie 
Burch served as co-hos- 
tesses.

Ritual ceremonies were 
held for two new me m ­
bers,  Joan Lewis and 
Claire Brown Jana St. 
Clair was installed as the 
new corresponding secre­
tary.

Mrs. Purdy demonstrated 
various dance steps for the 
sorority.

Refreshments of st raw­
berry short cake, tea and 
cokes were served to 
Claire Brown, Joan Lewis, 
Jana St. Clair, Lee Stil- 
well, Rickie Warren,  Pat 
Black, Vickie Burch, Kathy 
Hill, Cindy Purdy and 
Karren Renner.

afflcara la XI Omicron XI. Plctarad left to right,  are Barbara Flaaey,  prealdeat;  Judy 
Wllbaaka, a k a  prealdeat) Lyaaa Bax, recerdlag eecretaryt Saadi  Cbltweed,
corresponding secretary; Marjorie Merrit t ,  t reaanrer  and Karen [Clifford] Black, 
- - - - - - 1--. . f i u . .

EXEMPLA1 CHAPTER MEMBERS. . .Pledge  Rltaala were held May 1 to Install six 
new members In XI Omicron XI. Plctnred, left to r ight,  are Linda Marr ,  Vicki Black, 
Debbie Foster, Gayla Toombs, Lindy Schuster and Rhonda Little.

The regular meeting of 
Muleshoe Chapter # 792, 
Order of the Eastern Star, 
was held Tuesday evening, 
May 1 in Masonic Hall, 
under the supervision of 
Eulaine Phillips, Worthy 
Matron and Alton Epting, 
Associate Patron, serving 
in the Worthy Patron’s 
office in the absence of

business was

transacted and plans made 
for a closed installation of 
officers to be held June 5 
in Masonic Hall. The of­
ficers for 1979-80 are Mr. 
and Mrs.  Wayne Williams, 
Worthy Patron and Wor­
thy Matron; Mr.  and Mrs. 
Alton Epting, Associate 
Patron and Associate Ma ­
tron; Mary Farley, secre­
tary; Mrs.  Alex Williams, 
t reasurer;  Mrs.  Frank

M any colors and fashions for her 

O n her day

T h e swing is to the casual look 

H ow  lovely she will be 

Either in a shell or blouse or outfit 

R ead y  to wear 

Selections are great

U resses for a warm afternoon 

A n d  slacks, shorts and blazers 

Y o u ’ll enjoy seeing her wear

that special gift 
from—
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Hinkson, conductress;  
Mrs. Wyle Bullock, asso­
ciate conductress;  Alex 
Williams, chaplain; Curtis 
Wellborn, Marshal;  Ruth 
McCarty,  organist;  Mrs. 
Derrell Nowell, Adah; 
Clara Lou Jones,  Ruth; Jo 
Ann Head,  Esther;  Bever­
ly Capps,  Martha;  Mrs.  
Curtis Wellborn, Electa; 
Wyle Bullock, Warder and 
Owen Jones,  Sentinel.

Invitations to Friendship 
Night were received from 
Bonita Chapter  #184, 
Amarillo, to be held May 5 
at 7 p.m. and from Friends 
in District 4, Section 5 and 
to a brunch honoring Elise 
Hammack,  Grand Exa­
miner of District 3, May 26 
in Houston.

A letter from Beulah 
Speer, Idalou, Grand 
Examiner for District 2, 
reports the following m em ­
bers of Muleshoe Chapter 
receiving ‘A ’ Certificates 
at the Eastern Star School 
in Plainview on May 1, 
Mary Farley, Lavonne 
Hinkson, Eulaine Phillips 
and Louise W illiam s.

Eulaine Phillips served 
refreshments to members.

• * • • •
The best  way to kill time 

is to get busy and work it 
to death.

When the grass looks 
greener on the other side 
of the fence, it may be that 
they take better care of it 
over there.

• • * • •
It is the little things that 

annoy us; we can sit on a 
mountain but not on a 
tack.

ALPHA ZETA PI RITUALS.. .Jaaa St. Clair, left was laatalled aa Alpha Zeta PI 
Corresponding Secretary. Joan Lewis, center and Claire Brown \ 

mem bers.

/> Muleshoe 
Singing Group

J  Meets <j'

The Muleshoe Singing 
Group met in Fellowship 
Hall of the Trinity Baptist 
Church on April 28 at 7:30 
p . m .

Zeb Robinson called the 
meeting to order with the 
theme song, “ Showers of 
Blessings” .

There were 26 present 
including nine from Clovis. 
Mrs. Rachael Thompson of 
Clovis, N.M., formerly of 
Muleshoe, played the 
piano. Cecil Rundell of 
Farwell and Wayne Mar­
low of Muleshoe were also 
present.  Others visiting 
were Mrs. Hattie McQuire 
of Clovis, N.M.,  Mrs. 
W.C. Maxey of Earth, 
Mrs. J.C. Shanks of Mule­

shoe and Mrs. Eva Ash­
ford of Muleshoe.

All enjoyed the solos, 
duets,  quartets and con­
gregational hymns.

The invocation was given 
by Mrs.  Mae Wilterding 
and Mrs. Jane James  of 
Enochs gave the benedic­
tion.

Installed

Think naught  a trifle, 
though it small ap­
pear;

Small sands make the 
mountain,  moments 
make the year.

And trifles life.
-Young.

This Mom Does Dishes

#
&

This Mom Fixes Bikes

This Mom Fills Wishes

kes A orov (/ v»

This Mom Makes 

A Home

For Daddy and Me!

Mother’s Day Weekend

Sat. May 12th 10-6:30 p.m. 
Sun. May 13th 1-6:30 p.m.

Holiday Inn 
2700 E. Mabry Dr.

Clovis, N.M.
Sponsored By:

Hi-Plains Art Dealers Assoc.

Q 'fto r /ie r

u to r f/i  

r e m e tn / ie r tn y  

on

W a y
A watch is a g ift 
Mother will al­
ways remember 
and will remain a 
keepsake

Choose From 
Butovas, 

Wittnauers, 
Caravelles 

Jubilees 
& Seiko

Lindsey’s 
Jewelry

= z 2 0 2 * « i i =
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We are “encouraged” that potentially damaging cuts in 
cotton research funds and Commodity Credit Corporation 
credits, proposed in the President’s budget, will be restored 
by the House Agricultural Appropriations Subcommittee and 
will have a reasonable chance of survival in the full Appro- 
pnations Committee and on the House floor.

This was how officials of Plains Cotton Growers, Inc., 
Lubbock, felt April 25 on their return from Washington 
D.C. where they attended a two-day meeting of the Cotton 
Producer Steering Committee and joined that group in 
registering opposition to a cut of S3.42 million in agricultural 
research funds for 1980. Almost half that amount, $1,647,000 
would come from research on cotton and cottonseed.

“ In view of the overall increase of 7.7 percent in the 
President’s budget." points out PCG Executive Donald Johnson, 
“we-think it unfair that agriculture be singled out for such 
a drastic research cut. Moreover." he adds, “it seems equally 
inequitable for almost half the total reduction to come out 
of cotton money.”

CCC credits, if the President has his way would be cut 
almost in half. “These are vital to cotton exports." Johnson 
argues, “and are used for interest bearing loans with an 
excellent record of repayment, so in the long run they cost 
the government nothing."

The High Plains area is particularly upset by the proposed 
research fund reduction because it is almost certain that 
approval of the President’s budget as it was sent to Congress 
would result in the loss of approximately SI 70,000 in 
Federal funds for the 15-year-old PCG Boll Weevil Control 
Program. The program is conducted each year under a 
matching funds agreement with USDA s Animal and Plant 
Health Inspection Service.

“ So a loss of $170,000 in Federal funds in effect would 
reduce moneys available for the weevil program by a total 
of $340,000.” notes Ed Dean, PCG Field Service Director. 
“And such a loss would seriously endanger the future 
effectiveness of a joint producer-government program that 
has kept the boll weevil off the High Plains and out of West 
Texas. New Mexico and Arizona cotton since 1964.”

Johnson, Dean, PCG President Lloyd Cline of Lamesa, 
and Board Chairman W. B. Criswell of Idalou. while in 
Washington met with Congressmen Jack Hightower of Vernon, 
Kent I lance of Lubbock, Charles Stenholm of Stamford, and 
visited the offices of Texas Senators John Tower and Lloyd 
Bcntsen. All expressed support for restoring boll weevil funds, 
other agricultural research funds and CCC credit moneys. 
Hightower, a member of the Agricultural Appropriations 
Subcommittee, voiced confidence that the budget would 
reflect his support when it comes from the Subcommittee.

Each of the three Congressmen has counties in his district 
that are involved in and/or protected by the boll weevil 
program.

Wheat Farmers To Harvest 
About 150 Million Bushels

AUSTIN—Texas wheat 
producers are expected to 
harvest some 150.3 million 
bushels this year, almost tw ice 
the small 1978 cpop, but still 
below fhe 1977 level. Agricul­
ture Commissioner Reagan 
V Brown has announced 

Brown said the latest Texas 
Crop and Livestock Report­
ing Service surveys show 
increases in all wheat-growing 
areas, but that expected pro­
duction would still be 10 per 
cent below that of 1977. 

Many farmers cut back on

their planting last year in 
response to low prices and in 
compliance with the govern­
ment's set-aside program The 
1978 yield was 54 million 
bushels.

1 he prospects are good for 
the growth of wheat this year.

Tornado damage to crops 
in the Wichita Falls and 
Vernon areas has not been 
assessed as yet. There are 
around 200,(MX) acres of wheat 
planted in Wilbarger and 
Wichita counties each year. 
Brown said.

SLICK UP YOUR PICK UP
"TREAD BRITE " A LU M IN U M  

R U N N IN G  BOARDS

Wo ve Got All The 
Accessories For 

Your Truck!

•  Strong *k.d 'Mutant w rfoct tFroTe-iike f,ru$K 
•Protects body from rock <h.p» and mud »p'o»ter-

ings, will not rust or p rrl
•Eo sy  entry for your pickup, von, mo'o' or

4 x4 , fits most trucks including imports

Johnnie’s Safety 
Center

3 2 0  E. Amer. B lv d .

New Nuclear Weapons 
In Russia ‘Disturbing’

JUNIOR HORSE TEAM.. .Members  of the Bailey
County 4-H Junior Horse Judging Team won the right 
to compete at the State Round-Up In June at College 
Station. Members  of the team Include, from left, back 
row, Kim Farmer  and Brenda Flowers, and front row( 
from left, Tamara Gilliland and Krlatl Splea.

Restaurant...
Cont. from page 1
ties.

In the main dining room, 
the serving area will be 
separated from the dining 
room by a split rail fence.

“ We feel Mule shoe could 
use three to four more 
res taurants ,”  said Belt, 
“ and we plan to be open 
from 6 a.m. to 11 p.m. 
each day.”

He said the menu will be 
kept limited in order to 
serve good quality food 
and assure good service.

An additional feature 
planned is a breakfast  for 
one price and a noon 
special Merchant ’s Type 
luncheon, with a changed 
menu for the luncheon

4-H...
Cont. from page 1
petition and first High 
Team in Halter Judging.  
Kim Farmer was second in 
Halter Judging as an indi­
vidual; third high indivi­
duals in Halter Judging 
were Tamara Gilliland and 
Brenda Flowers. Brenda 
was also third in Perform­
ance and third high indi­
vidual overall.
Team members include 

Kim Farmer,  Tamara Gil­
liland. Brenda Flowers and 
Kristi Spies. Their coaches 
are Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Farmer.

Third high team overall 
and third high team in 
Beef Judging was the 
Junior Livestock Judging 
Team. Team members in­
cluded Jerry Gleason. 
Tracy Tunnell,  Darin Shaw 
and Ricky Rasco. Coach is 
Spencer Tanksley.

Placing third overall was 
the junior rifle team . Team 
members are Jim Holmes, 
Kevin Harris and Jay 
Gleason and coaches are 
Jim Shafer and John 
H arris.

□
T E X A S  P R E SS  
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W hite C o m
USDA Projected Production Reduced 

22% Below 1978 Production.
New Single Cross Asgrow 

White Corn Seed Now Available.

We Have Approximately 
100 Varieties

Of Garden Seed On Hand.

Ray Griffiths & Sons, Inc.
North End Of Main Mulenhoe 2 7 2 -4 5 8 5

each day.
His son, David Belt, who 

recently completed school­
ing in food management  
and sanitation, w ill be 
operating the restaurant.  
According to the plans, 
barbecue will be the fea­
tured item, with regular 
and small size rib plates; 
regular and small size 
sliced beef plates, both 
barbecue chicken and fried 
chicken; steaks; a very 
special potato; and at spe­
cial times,  barbecued 
shrimp. Also, with an eye 
toward the ladies'  and men 
who appreciate good 
salads, they promise a 
variety of salads, many of 
them will be a ‘meal in a 
salad'  with a probably 
emphasis on featured 
salads.

Belt said the restaurant  
was designed with future 
expansion of the motel in 
mind, and in the future, 
does plan to add more 
units to the existing struc­
ture.

“ Once again the Soviet 
Union has shown total 
disdain for the unilateral 
concessions made by the 
Administration in restrict­
ing the introduction of new 
nuclear weapons into the 
European theate r ,”  Sena­
tor John Tower (R-Tex) 
declared today in response 
to announcement  of the 
deployment of a new Sovi­
et tactical nuclear missile 
in Eastern Europe.

“ At the very instant the 
Carter Administration is 
saying the SALT II agree­
ment is virtually complet­
ed, the Soviets apparently 
feel quite comfortable in 
injecting an element of 
instability in U.S. • Soviet 
relations by deploying the 
SS-21 tactical nuclear mis­
sile. The United States, on 
the other hand,  has long 
since decided against the 
early deployment of an 
enhanced radiation wea­
pon ,”  Tower stated.

Tower said this latest 
move on the part of the 
Soviet government,  rein­
forces the position taken 
by many opponents of the 
SALT II agreement  that 
the treaty must be examin­
ed in the broader context 
of overall U.S.-Soviet re­
lations, including Soviet 
adventures in Africa, the 
Middle East and else­
where,  and the balance of 
U.S.-Soviet conventional 
military and naval
s t rength .

“ This country is rapidly 
reaching an unacceptable 
level of military strength 
vis-a-vis the Soviet Union. 
The lack of “ equali ty”  in 
the SALT II accord will 
only accelerate that de­
cline. This latest example 
of Soviet intimidation •• 
the introduction of the 
SS-21 — should hopefully 
convince the Administra­
tion that no amount of 
goodwill on our part will be 
reciprocated. We must 
deal from a position of 
strength and determina­
tion or be content with 
ultimate, and perhaps ir­
retrievable, inferiority,” 
Tower added.

The senior Texas senator 
said it is time for the

Bailey ( nunl\ Journal uWMOtw
Established Mir. h 31 1963 Published bs Muleshoe Publishing 
Co Inc Every Sundas xl kM W Seiood Box 449 Muleshoe 
Texas. > 1 4 ' Se.ond class Postage paid at Muleshoe le n s  
79.14 ’

Specials At Cobb’s
Men's Dept.

Special G roup -Values To $14 .00
Sport & Dress Shirts Now I J 9 9

Special G roup Ties Now $1°°  
Special G roup Gold Toe
F lu f fy  S o c k s  Reg- $2.00 ^ o w  5 0 *

E M E m / a
L a d i e s

Speieal Group Ladies Co-Ordinates

75% Off & More
DOUAR M K

Jr. Dept.
Special Group*

UpT" 80% Off
Fantastic Bargains

Childrens
Special Group Girls

Panties
N ow

Various Other Items

e h ^ j
Boys Dept. Now

Special G roup Of W ranglers $ 2 "
Values To $11 .50  

Special G roup  Socks N o w  5 0 *
_____ Great Savings

Ladies Jewelry & Scarves
Up To

lelry i
16% Off

S A V E  IN  E V E R Y  D E P T .

Carter Administration to 
immediately reassess its 
entire approach to the 
SALT II agreement  as well 
as its basic foreign policy, 
and to do so before sub­
mitting the treaty to the 
Senate for ratification.

“ It will be very difficult to 
conduct any meaningful 
consideration of the SALT 
treaty in the absence of a 
full understanding of what 
this Administration really 
wants for the United States 
in terms of its leadership 
in the world.”

ONE MINUTE SPORTS 0UI2
1. Who won the Tournament 
Players Golf Tournament?
2. Who won the Shavers- 
Norton boxing bout?
3. Who won the LPGA Sahara 
National Pro-Am?
4. Who won the NCAA 
basketball championship?
5. Who was named MVP of 
the game?

Answ ers to Sports Ooii
1. Lanny Wadkins.
2. Shavers in the 1st round.
3. Nancy Lopez.
4. Michigan State 75. Indiana 
State 64.
5. Earvin "Magic" Johnson.

O u t o f^ rb it

Consumer 
Food News

Best buys at Texas gro­
cery markets this week 
include poultry items, 
pork, canned produce and 
some fresh produce, 
Gwendolyne Clyatt re ­
ports.

M rs. Clyatt is a consumer 
marketing information 
specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension 
Service, The Texas A&M 
University System.
This week’s price - quali­

ty trends are the follow­
ing:
POULTRY...Egg prices 
are attractive, along with 
turkey prices, especially 
on turkey parts. Fryer 
chickens have higher 
prices, but they are still a 
protein bargain,  so buy 
extras and freeze for later.

Some markets offer bon­
ed chicken breast ,  but 
check the prices before 
buying. It may be more 
economical to bone chick­
en at home.
PORK.. .Prices are a bit 
lower as supplies increase. 
More supply increases are 
expected later in the year 
forsing prices down even 
further.  Specials include 
end and loin chops, qua r ­
ter - loin cut into chops, rib 
end roasts, frankfurters

and liver.
ALONG GROCERY
MARKET AISLES

Features include canned 
fruits and vegetables,  sal­
mon, tuna, sugar,  bread, 
pancake mix and syrup. 
FROZEN FOODS.. .  Best 
buys are strawberries,  
pies, ice cream and vege­
tables.
DAIRY.. .Features are 
cheeses,  milk, sour cream 
and yogurt.
FRESH VEGETABLES.. .
Best buys at moderate 
prices include carrots, 
celery, head lettuce, dry 
onions and squash,  along 
with collards, mustards,  
turnips and greens.

Asparagus prices are as 
economical as they will be, 
but cauliflower and cab­
bage prices are high due to 
short supplies caused by 
bad weather.
FRESH FRUITS...  Best 
buys at moderate prices 
include bananas,  apples, 
pineapple,  avocadoes and 
pears.

Pear quality is excellent, 
but let them ripen at room 
temperature a few days. 
Apples are from “ controll­
ed storage,”  so refrigerate 
them to maintain quality.

Strawberries are avail­
able, but consumers can 
expect better berries and 
lower prices in about two 
weeks.

THEY SHOULD HAVE PICKED 
Y O U -Y O U ’RE A  PERFECT 
ASTRONAUT! £ * ; •

Attention 
Graduate!
St Clairs Has 

Your Tuxedo For 
The Junior-Senior 

Banquet
\ \ * °  xX> i nXX

Q t .  C f o iA S

cJj***.

HERE’S 
WHAT 
YOU 

CAN DO 
ABOUT 

IT!

TH ER M O S TA T
SETTING
Keep your therm ostat 
set at 78° or higher in 
the sum m er. Turn the 
unit off if you’re going  
to be away for several 
days.

W E A T H E R S T R IP P IN G  
A N D  C A U LK IN G  
R eplace m issing or 
w o rn  w e a th e rs tr ip -  
ping and caulk around  
the outside of doors  
and w indow s to stop  
costly  drafts and cool 
air loss.

M A IN T E N A N C E  
AND FILTER S  
Have a q ua lified  ser­
vicem an check your 
air cond itioner sea 
sonally and keep it at 
top operating e ffic i­
ency. Check the filters  
every 30 days and 
clean  or rep lace w hen  
dirty.

IN S U LA TIO N  
To get m ore for your 
energy dollar, install 
proper insulation in 
a tt ic s ,  w a lls  and  
around c e n tra l, a ir  
ducts.

S O U T H W E S T E R N  P U B L I C  S E R V I C E

For m ore energy & m oney saving tips, 
call or w rite  for our FREE booklets. 909 12



Volume 14 Number 15

Sham

Koran Stovall A nd  JoRonda Rhodot

Official Publication of Muleshoe High School W ritten and Edited by Students of the Muleshoe Schools

Sunday ,May o ,1979

Lloyd ‘79 Valedictorian, Salutatorian

STEPHANIE BELL BBENT BUIBOWS DEBBIE HALL MAKE HARMON SHANNON KENNEDY

CECIL MARD1S JEEP SHANKS STEVE TURNER KAREN STOVALL DICKEY SUDDUTH

Student Teachers Completing Year
Ms. Carol Fritzky, a sen­

ior at Eastern New Mexi­
co University has been an 
asset to the speech and 
dram a departm ent of M H S 
as she has done her stu­
dent teaching under the 
supervision of Mr. Kerry 
M oore.

Carol attended the Uni­
versity of New Mexico in 
Albuquerque for two and a 
half years before moving 
to Portales and entering 
Eastern New Mexico in 
1977.

Ms. Fritzky will receive 
h e r B . A . d e g r e e o n M a y  11 
with a major in Theatre/  
Communication and a 
minor in Fine Arts. She 
has been active in theatre 
and has done dramatic 
plays as well as musical 
comedies and ballet per­
formances. She started the

Study: Saccharin ban said 
unnecessary.

Center Stage Society Pro­
gram at ENMU to support 
the Theatre Department.

Ms. Fritzky is a member 
of Alpha Psi Omega; na­
tional honorary dramatic 
fraternity; Phi Kappa Phi; 
a national honor society; 
Secondary School Theatre 
Association and is p re ­
sident of the New Mexico 
Theatre Association Stu­
dent League.

In addition to graduating 
Magna Cum Laude, Ms. 
Fritzky received the award 
by the Department of Edu­
cation at ENMU for Out­
standing Promise as a 
secondary teacher.

Thomas Manley has also 
student  taught at MHS in 
Texas History under the 
supervision of Don Eiland 
and in the Physical Edu­
cation Department.

Defense Secretary: New 
draft no panacea.

Mr. Manley is from Phi­
ladelphia, Pennsylvania. 
When not in school, he 
lives with his parents and 
two sisters and two broth­
ers. He also has two 
married sisters. Mr. Man- 
ley graduated from High­
land High School in the 
spring of 1973 and enter ­
ed ENMU the same year 
where he was on a foot­
ball scholarship.

He played football for 
Eastern for four years, and 
will receive his bachelor’s 
degree in Education on 
M ay 11.

Manley will return to 
Philadelphia to teach at 
Highland High where he 
graduated.
Muleshoe students and 

faculty have appreciated 
having these outstandine

Muleshoe boasts to have 
two to claim the “ Best of 
MH S” title this week. 
Both are state qualifiers -  
Fran Berryhill in speech 
and Shelly Dunham in 
track.

Fran qualified for State in 
persuasive speaking. She 
placed at many tourna­
ments this year. In per­
suasive she places first at 
Friona, Texas Tech and 
W.T.S.U. large and small 
school. She placed second 
at Dalhart and Tascosa. 
She placed third at Here­
ford. In impromptu,  she 
placed first at W.T.S.U. 
large school. She got the Pi 
Kappa Delta award at 
WTSU. She recently plac­
ed first at district, second 
at regional, both in persua­
sive and honorable men­
tion in district one-act 
play. Fran, 17, and a 
junior, is the daughter  of 
Mr. and Mrs. Gil Lamb. 
She is the Band Vice 
President,  Student Council 
Representative and Twir- 
ler, and Kiwanis’ Sweet­
heart.  Last year she plac­
ed second in persuasive at 
State. When asked to com­
ment on her activities, she 
said, “ I have really enjoy­
ed school this year, espe­
cially speech. 1 am really 
thankful to be going to 
State to represent  MHS in

student  teachers in MHS 
during this spring semes-

CAROL FRITZKY

the best way I can. I’ve 
really gotten a lot of sup­
port from fellow students 
and I really want to thank 
them all. I especially thank 
Mr. Moore for being such 
a great  teacher and friend. 
I'm looking forward to next 
year; and I know with the 
kind of students MHS has, 
next year will be even 
better! I ”

Shelly qualified for State 
in the shot put and the 
discus. She placed in many 
track meets this year. In 
the shot put she placed 
second at Sundown, first at 
Bovina, second at Here­
ford, and first at District 
and second at regional. 
Shelly also placed first in 
the Mile Relay at District. 
Her best  in the shot this 
year is 42’ 3 1 / 2" .  Her

SHELLY DUNHAM

Custom Application
Herbicides-Insecticides

Fungicides

NA—Churs Fertilizer 
Liquid Nitrogen

We Now Have Available 
Side-Dress Rigs For 

Applying Liquid Nitrogen
& Liquid Blends. 
Also Available:

The Bohar Rope 
Wick Applicator

For More Information Call:

Ron Kidd
Day: 965-2374  

Night: 272-3705

THOMAS MANLEY

N0TES.C0MMENTS
You can't tell what a 

man thinks by what he
says.

best in the Discus this year 
is 119’ 10” . Shelly. 17. and 
a junior, is the daughter  of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Dun­
ham. She is the FTA 
Historian, Art Club Vice 
President and is active in 
Student Council and Athle­
tics. When asked to com­
ment on her activities, she 
said, "Track has been a lot 
of fun this year. We got 
started kind of slow, but it 
ended pretty good. I am 
looking forward to compet­
ing at the State Track and 
Field Meet in Austin. I 
hope next year our whole 
track team will get to 
compete in this mee t .”  

Muleshoe High is proud 
of the accomplishments of 
these girls and expresses 
their sincere congratula­
tions to th e m .

f i a n  b e r r y h i l l

MONDAY...
BREAKFAST

MILK
CEREAL

FRUIT

LUNCH

Honor graduates for 
Muleshoe High School 
have been released.

Miss Julia Shain, the 
daughter  of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Shain, has been 
named Valedictorian for 
the class of 1979. Miss 
Lavayne Lloyd has been 
named Salutatorian. She is, 
the daughter  of Mr. and 
Mrs.  Duane Lloyd.

Other honor graduates 
are Stephanie Bell, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. W. 
Don Bell; Brent Burrows, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. OI»"

f

Junior Brief
The Junior Program plan­

ning committee met Mon­
day, April 30, during third 
period. Coach Mayberry,  a 
Junior Class Sponsor, will 
head this committee.

Student Council 
Members Attend  

State Convention
Student Council members 

and their sponsor attended 
the Student Council State 
Convention in San Antonio 
on April 3, 4 and 5.

Attending from Muleshoe 
High School were 1978-79 
president Mark Harman; 
1979-80 president Mark 
Northcutt;  1978-79 vice 
president Melissa Bigger- 
staff; 1979-80 vice presi­
dent Clifford Watson; 
1979-80 secretary Shelley 
Splawn; 1978-79 historian 
Linda Shafer and 1979-80 
historian JoRonda Rhodes.

Voting delegates for the 
convention included Mark 
Harmon and Mark North­
cutt. The scrapbook pre­
pared by Linda Shafer was 
entered in state competi­
tion. Mr. and Mrs.  Keith 
Taylor accompanied the 
students to San Antonio.

MILK
BAKED HAM 

GREEN BEANS 
CREAMED POTATOES 

HOT ROLLS 
FRUIT

Senior Class 
Preparing For

TUESDAY...
BREAKFAST

MILK
HONEYBUNS

JUICE

LUNCH
MILK

HAMBURGERS 
LETTUCE 

TOMATOES 
PICKLES 
ONIONS 

FRENCH FRIES 
COBBLER

WEDNESDAY.. .
BREAKFAST

MILK
TOAST
JELLY

SAUSAGE
FRUIT

LUNCH
MILK

GREEN ENCHILADA 
CASSEROLE 

PINTO BEANS 
BUTTERED SPINACH 

CORNBREAD 
PEANUT BUTTER 

CONFECTION

THURSDAY...
MILK

CEREAL
FRUIT

LUNCH
MILK

HOT DOGS 
CHEESE STICKS 
FRENCH FRIES 

FRUIT JELLO 
TOSSED SALAD

FRIDAY...
MILK

OATMEAL
TOAST
JUICE

LUNCH
MILK

CHICKEN AND 
DRESSING 

ENGLISH PEAS 
SWEET POTATOES 

HOT ROLLS 
FRUIT

Graduation
On Monday, April 30, the 

Senior class met to discuss 
further plans for g radua­
tion.

To begin the meeting the 
seniors received their invi­
tations. Also they elected 
escorts and ushers for 
graduation. Mike North­
cutt and JoRonda Rhodes 
were selected escorts. The 
class selected Becky Turn­
er, Shelly Dunham, Fran 
Berryhill, Mona Price, 
Curtis Elder, Mark North­
cutt, Cam Hawkins and 
Zeke Pecina as ushers.

Senior Day is scheduled 
for May 18. A special 
assembly will be hosted by 
the Senior class. The as­
sembly will feature differ­
ent things that have hap­
pened to the seniors dur­
ing their four years at 
M.H.S.  The theme of the 
Senior Day will be “ Fa­
mous People” .

Wednesday,  May 2, sen­
ior mothers met and plan­
ned a reception honoring 
the graduating class, to be 
held following Commence­
ment,  May 25.

)  C a l e n d a r  j

( For th« Wtik 5

MAY 7-12
Monday, May 7 — Senior 
Class meeting

HECF. Meeting. 
Tuesday.  May 8 -- National 
Honor Society Initiation 
and Dinner -• Corral Res­
taurant.
Thursday,  May 10 •• Farm 
Mechanics Contest -- Tech 
-- 1 p.m.
Saturday, May 12 — FTA 
District Meeting.

Burrows; Debbie Hall, 
daughter  of Mr. and Mrs. 
T.R. Hall; Mark Harmon, 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Harmon; Shannon 
Kennedy,  daughter  of Mr 

and Mrs. Clinton Ken­
nedy; Cecil Mardis,  the 
son of Clifford Mardis; 
Jeep Shanks, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Gerald Shanks; 
Karen Stovall, daughter  of 
Mr. and Mrs.  David Sto­
vall; Dickey Sudduth,  son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Dave 
Sudduth and Steve Turn­
er, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Rovce Turner.

The following people of 
MHS will be celebrating 
their birthdays the week of 
May 7-13. The Mule’s Tale 
Staff would like to wish 
them a Very Happy Birth­
day!! !
Monday. May 7 — Lucas 
Garcia, Gracie Garcia. 
Tuesday, May 8 -• Sandy 
Berkgren, Terry Williams, 
Debra Bouchelle, Tommy 
Edmundson,  Earl Madrid. 
Thursday, May 10 -  Jim 
Berry, Kevin Jones.
Friday, May 11 -- Gloria 
A nguiano.
Saturday, May 12 — Mary 
Graves.

Auto Mechanics 

Host Visitors
What is happening in the 

Auto Mechanics class? 
April 24, 1979, Auto Me­
chanics Classes were 
honored to have a program 
presented by Roger Berks, 
Area Sales Representative 
from Amarillo and Cecil L. 
Sheffield, Service Train­
ing and Sales Representa ­
tive from Carrollton, Tx. 
They represent  AC-Delco, 
a division of General 
Motors Corporation.

The program was care 
and maintenance of High 
Energy Ignition and Air 
Conditioner Safety.

Dewey Moore from Mo­
hawk Auto Parts called 
and invited local mecha­
nics to the training ses ­
sion. The Auto Mechanics 
Department was pleased 
to have the mechanics 
meet with them for the 
special p rogram.

Money making projects 
for the Auto Mechanics 
depar tment  this year were 
a 428 Ford Irrigation En­
gine and all parts to re­
build donated by Joe' s  
Garage,  which has been 
sold, and a 428 Ford 
Irrigation Engine donated 
by Don Bryant, to be 
rebuilt and sold. Things 
like this keep Auto Mecha­
nic students in training 
and help finance trips.

If you want a future in 
mechanics,  check with 
Auto Mechanics.

Band Takes 
Annual Trip 
To Six Flags
On Thursday,  April 26, 

the Mighty ” M ” Band 
traveled to Fort Worth to 
participate in the annual 
Six Flags Band Festival, 
held at the University of 
Texas in Arlington.

The band left on Thurs ­
day morning and arrived in 
Fort Worth that night. On 
Friday, the band went to 
Six Flags to a Buddy Rich 
concert clinic. The Band 
competed on Saturday 
morning, playing "March 
Glorius” , “ Battaglia” , 
and “ Credence,”  and re­
ceived a II rating.

After the contest ,  every­
one went to Six Flags and 
enjoyed the day.

The band left Fort Worth 
early Sunday morning and 
arrived back in Muleshoe 
late that afternoon.
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Mr. and Mrs. Mark Rice 
of Denver,  Colo., visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Roby Lynn 
over the Easter weekend.} 

• • •  • •
Mr. and Mrs.  Charlie 

Nichols of Spring spent  the 
Easter weekend with his 
mother,  Mrs. Rodney 
Nichols. They returned 
Monday and their children 
Chad and Jodi, returned 
home with them.

* • * * •
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 

Maxwell of Frederick, 
Okla., visited during the 
weekend with his parents,  
Mr. and Mrs.  Martin Max­
well and their daughter ,  
Mr. and Mrs.  Glen Tester- 
man and children. Mary 
Lena took Mrs. Martin 
Maxwell to Amarillo to see 
the eye doctor one day 
while she was here.

• • * • •
Mrs.  Halbert Harvey 

and her mother,  Mrs.  Lo- 
vella Kendricks were in 
Amarillo one day last 
week.

bock visited this past  week 
with her parents,  Mr. and 
Mrs.  Wayne Doty.

• • • • •
Burk Tollett of Lubbock 

spent  the Easter weekend 
with his parents,  Mr. and 
Mrs.  Marvin Tollett.

» •  • * •
Mr. and Mrs.  Olin Nix 

were in Lubbock recently 
for a picnic and the horse 
races.  Some friends of 
Lamesa met them there.

• • • • •
Mickey Gilbert of Alien 

was a Sudan visitor last 
week and at tended the 
funeral services for his 
father,  Henry Gilbert.

* • • • •
Mr. and Mrs. Jack En- 

gram were in Dumas dur ­
ing the Easter weekend 
with their son, Mr. and 
Mrs.  Kim Engram. They 
took their grandchildren, 
Brad and Ginger home. 
They all at tended church 
services there Sunday 
morning.

Mr. and Mrs.  David 
Kelly and Randy of Lub­
bock visited Sunday with 
his aunt  and family, Mr. 
and Mrs.  B.A. Beau­
champ,  Jr.

Mrs.  Vicki Brewer of
Jo Gave Doty of Lub- Eu n ice. N.M. h».  been

i$ VALUEŜ  We Have In
Steel 1 Pound, 1 Foot Sfocfc: 

o r a truck load
Concrete Supplies
Rebar, Wire Remesh,

Foundation Bolts
Oxygen, Acetylene,

Welding Rods
Tool Bars, Gage Wheels, Shanks 

And Clamps or Sweeps 
Bolts or Hand Tools

Livestock Supplies
Fencing Wire, Posts, Insulators,

Fence Charges or Panels.
Come By And Check Our Prices,

ThiWe Think You'll Find We Are 
Very Competitive!

We Are Also Your Dealer For Hale: Stock 
Horse, Implement and Grain Trailers.

Wilhite Supply
Ph. 272-4975 Box 5047 W, Hwy, 84

here with her parents,  
Rev. and Mrs.  Doug Gard­
ner. Mrs.  Brewer 's hus­
band is a patient in the 
Methodist  Hospital in Lub­
bock.

Mr. and Mrs. Noel 
Lumpkin of Graham were 
recent visitors with his 
sister, Mrs.  Jane  Rone and 
other friends.

Weekend visitors with 
Mr. and Mrs.  Harold Ingle 
were her mother and a 
friend.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs.  A.J. Ro­

berts has been to Wichita 
Falls recently and was 
there when the tornado hit 
that city.

Recent visitors in the 
home of Edith Williams 
was her son, Gedonne of 
Clovis, N.M.,  his daughter  
Mr. and Mrs.  Larry Puck­
ett and sons, Kalen and 
Kevin of Muleshoe. The 
group visited Mrs. Alex­
ander of the Amherst  
Manor.  While there,  they 
took a picture of the five 
generations.

Mr. and Mrs. Claud 
Kropp were in Hereford 
Saturday to visit their dau­
ghter,  Mr. and Mrs. Char­
les Minchew and boys.

• • •  • •
Mr. and Mrs.  John Hen ­

derson of Whiteface were 
Wednesday visitors with 
their daughter and family, 
the Bob Nelsons.

• • •  • •
Mrs.  Lucille Fox is vaca­

tioning in Alexandria, Va., 
'visiting with her daughter,  
Mr. and Mrs.  Mark Hicks. 

• • • • *
LMrs. Joe Wyatt  is leav­

ing for El Paso to visit her 
son for a few days, then on 
to San Diego, Calif., to 
visit her granddaughter a 
few days.

Mr. and Mrs.  Lenord 
Pierce and Celia were in 
San Angelo Friday night to 
attend Brad’s Block and 
Bridal Club Banquet.

* * * • •
Recent visitors with Mr. 

and Mrs.  Leonard Cline 
and Celia were their child­
ren and grandchildren, 
Mr. and Mrs.  Bruce Pier­
ce, Heather and Heath of 
Lamesa, Mr. and Mrs.  
Bobby Foster, Lacretia and 
Robyn of Farwell and Mr. 
and Mrs. Randy Pierce of 
Amherst .

1X3
Sounds like 

multiplication?
Guess again!

IPs newspaper talk 
for a one column 

by 3 inch ad.

Too small to be 
effective? 

Your’re reading 
this one!

C o i r l h o v s e

M a w s

RIFLE TEAM COMPETED.. .The Bailey County 4-H Junior and Senior Rifle team 
competed In District action at Lubbock last weekend.  Pictured, from left, are John 
Harris,  coach; Michael Isaac, Jim Holmes, Terry Shafer, and Jim Shafer, coach. 
Front row, from left, are Dans Holmes,  Jay Gleason and Kevin Harris.

• ■' I
MARRIAGE LICENSES...

Amador Paez Mendoza, 
42 of Muleshoe and Ade- 
linda Carrasco Mendoza,
26 of Chihuchua,  Old 
M exico.

Antonio Yruegas,  26 of 
Littlefield and Yolanda 
Reyna Moreno, 23 of Pear­
sall.

DIVORCES GRANTED.. .
Lenora Ruth mallouf and 

Abraham John Mallouf.
Thomas Earl Beal and 

Bennie Jean Beal.
Wanda , Ladene Spears 

and Leon Lester Spears.

T h r e e  W a y  

S c h o o l  M e n u

MONDAY.. .
BREAKFAST 

BUTTERED CINNAMON 
BUNS 
JUICE 
MILK

LUNCH
LASAGNA

MASHED POTATOES 
CORN

HOT ROLLS 
APPLESAUCE 

MILK

TUESDAY...
BREAKFAST

CEREAL
JUICE
MILK

LUNCH
FISH

TARTER SAUCE 
FRENCH FRIES 

COLE SLAW 
HOT ROLLS 

PEARS 
MILK

WEDNESDAY.. .
BREAKFAST

TOAST
JELLY
JUICE
MILK

LUNCH
VEG.BEEF SOUP 

TOASTED CHEESE SAN. 
SALAD

NO BAKE COOKIES

PEANUTS
MILK

THURSDAY...
BREAKFAST

BUTTERED ROLLS 
HONEY 
JUICE 
MILK

LUNCH
PIZZA DOGS 

MASHED POTATOES 
GREEN BEANS

CHOCOLATE CAKE 
MILK

FRIDAY...
BREAKFAST
PANCAKES

SYRUP
JUICE
MILK

LUNCH
HAMBURGERS 
FRENCH FRIES 

ONION 
PICKLES 
LETTUCE 

TOMATOES 
COOKIES 

MILK

Electric Irrigation Well 
Motors And Controls 

Contact

O W EN'S
e l e c t r ic :

364-3572 - Hereford - 809 2nd St

Soybean Seed
We Have Several

Different Varieties.
Including:

Certified Essex 
Yorks 

Clark 63 
Non Certified 

Columbus
Also

Northrup King 
Asgrow &

Ring-Around Soybean 
Seed Available

Farwell
ldi G w  Tot You*’ O fc. Ph. 481-3810

Kleenex
Paper Towels
Single Roll Pack

2 FOR

100

STOIC 
HOURS: 

M ON-SAT. t - J

KLEENEX
FACIA!
TISSUI

L 
■ >

5
c

8
200
ount

t

OREO COOKES 15 Oz. Pkg.

BIC
Disposable Shavers

8
For

•  Travel companion
•  Close sharp shave
•  Perfect for legs & arms

The Perfect 
Way To F ill 
A Vacuum

DELUXE
AIR
POT

Holds Over 2 Full Quarts

Now
Only

799

The most amazing vacuum bottle ever made 
releases just the right amount with a gentle 
push, keeps freshness, cool or hot for hour 
after hour.

G et MORE 

F o f Y o u r l

M o n ey !

Dove
For Dishes

32 oz. King Size

8 8 *
Save!

TUNA Chicken of 
The Sea

6V2 Oz. Can 69
Priest Good While Quontities Lost

EVERY DAY
LOW PRICES

Gal. Homo Milk $£05
1/2 Gal. Homo M ilk 96*
Gal. Lowfat Milk *1 "
l/2Gal.Lowfat ....94*
1/2 Gal. Buttermilk... 98*
2 Lb. Cottage Cheese f|69
1 Lb. Cottage Cheese 91*
Sour Cream 49*
Whipping Cream 58*
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MONDAY.. .

BBVAKFAST
CEREAL

JUICE
MILK

LUNCH
FISH

PORK AND BEANS 
PEANUT BUTTER 

JELLY

BUTTER
YEAST BISCUITS 

MILK

TUESDAY...
BREAKFAST

TOAST
BACON
JELLY
FRUIT
MILK

LUNCH
SPAGHETTI 

MEAT SAUCE 
ENGLISH PEAS 

SWEET POTATOES 
CORN BREAD 

FRUIT 
MILK

C o n v e n ie n t
. . .  the 

24 hour 
bank

■ m
P  M ULES H O K ^  

STA TE BANK
101 AMERICAN BLVD • 272-4561 • Member FDIC

WEDNESDAY.. .
BREAKFAST

WAFFLES
SYRUP
JUICE
MILK

LUNCH
TURKEY ENCHILADAS 

PINTO BEANS 
GREEN SALAD 
CORN BREAD 

BUTR SCOTCH PUDDING 
MILK

THURSDAY...
BREAKFAST

OATMEAL
RAISINS

JUICE

LUNCH M,LK
HAMBURGERS OR 

SLOPPY JOES 
FRENCH FRIES 

PICKLES 
LETTUCE 
ONIONS 

COOKIES 
MILK

FRIDAY...
BREAKFAST

CEREAL
FRUIT
MILK

LUNCH
STEW

CHEESE STICKS 
BUTTERED RICE 
PEANUT BUTTER

CRACKERS 
CINNAMON ROLLS

MILK
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Foods Prom oted  
By Trade M ission

AUSTIN--Representatives 
of the Texas Department ol 
Agrieulture export team have 
recently returned from a 
Caribbean trade mission 
w here they p rom oted  
representative fresh and 
p rocessed  Texas food 
products.

Over 2,000 buyers for the 
hotel-restaurant, grocery and 
institutional markets in South 
America, Mexico and the 
Caribbean attended the 1979 
Food and Equi pment  
Exposition of the Caribbean, 
Carib-USA, in San Juan, 
Puerto Rico.

The Department, one of 15 
members of the Southern U.

S. trade Assn (SUSIA),  
operated a booth, Food from 
T e x a s - U S A ,  l e a t u r i n g  
products for the export 
market.

“Our participation in the 
exhibit was one more step 
toward offset t ing this 
country's trade deficit and 
making Texas number one in 
ag r i c u l t u r a l  e x p o r t s , ” 
comment ed Agricul ture 
Commissioner Reagan V. 
Brown

l.ast year, Texas was third 
in agricultural exports with 
nearly S2 billion in overseas 
trade Brown wants to see the 
figure increased to $4 billion 
in a few years.

World War II women pilots 
win veteran recognition.

SENIOR LIVESTOCK JUDGING TEAM...Becoming the aecond team eligible to 
compete In the State 4-H Round-up at College Station on Jane  5-6 waa the Senior 
Llveatock Team. Their membera Include from left, Jimmy Gleaaon, Alan Harrlaon, 
Greg Harrlaon and Kelly Harrlaon.

NursingHome
■ News

By Joy  StoRColl

f  It’s Her Day 
May 13th

Q m M  ê/ison

rT (ie  Q A io / ifc ( ....Q jo u / (

Show Her How 
Much You

Care
With A Gift 

From....
Free Gift wrap 

With $5.00 
Purchase

S t .  C % tits 272-4453

David Cox and women 
from the Muleshoe Church 
of Christ came Friday to 
give a devotional to the 
residents.  They served the 
residents punch and cake. 
Those attending were Ar­
thur and Chellie Bradley, 
Onnie McDaniel,  Marie 
Engram, Edna Henderson,  
Marie Patton, Maggie 
London, Archie Scarlett, 
Ed Parks, Tom Watson, 
Charlie Garth,  Abe Mal- 
louf, Carrie Boydston, 
Rose Sebring, Lottie Hall, 
Effie Splawn and George 
M allouf.

Children from the Mule- 
shoe United Methodist 
Child Care Center came to 
put  on a “ Tom Thumb 
Weddin g"  for the resi­
dents Friday.

E.B. Wilson came to 
hold Bible study with the 
residents Sunday morning. 
Their lesson was I Kings 
22, “ Daring to Speak the 
Tru th” .

Sunday afternoon, the 
Muleshoe Baptist Church 
came to sing to the resi­
dents.  In at tendance were 
Carrie Boydston, Marie 
Engram,  Effie Splawn, 
Maggie London, Annie 
Brown, Archie Scarlett, 
Dottie Wilterding, Charlie 
Garth,  Nellie B. Connell,

Remember 
Mom 

May
13th

IN TR O D U C IN G  RUSS TO C ’S® “SPRING REFLECTIONS’’ A T  30 OFF%
Soft shodes of Springtime m a 95% Treveria polyester and 5% Silk knit ensemble. 
Machine washable and dryable. Colors: Lavender and Natural. Sizes 8-18.

Solid pull-on pant 
Solid front panelled skirt 
Bias plaid A-lme skirt 
Solid two patch pocket vest 
Plaid long sleeve blazer with 2 patch pockets 
Polyester sheer print knit combo shirt 

Sizes S-M-L
Polyester pongee long sleeve tunic print with 

banded collar
Polyester sheer print knit short sleeve blouse 
Polyester sheer knit solid color blouse

Reg $16. 
Reg $17. 
Reg $20. 
Reg $19. 
Reg $30.

Reg $19.

Reg $23. 
Reg $18. 
Reg $17.

t i / L
c P A N T M O N  > C O

321 Main 
Mulenhoe, Texas

Lottie Hall, Berdie Phelps, 
Clara Angeley and Chellie 
Bradley.

Glenda Jennings came 
Wednesday to sing and 
visit with the residents.

• •  • •  •
The Hospital and Nurs­

ing Home Auxiliary came 
Tuesday to shampoo and 
set the women’s hair. Re­
sidents having their hair 
done were Edna Hender­
son, Marie Patton, Ber­
die Phelps, Maggie Lon­
don, Effie Splawn, Marie 
Engram,  Carrie Boydston, 
Dora Slaughter, Onnie Mc­
Daniel and Lottie Hall.

» • • •  •
Visiting with Margaret  

Jones were T.C. Wade of 
Whittharrel  and Clifford 
Butner of Muleshoe. Rafe 
Rodgers, her long time 
friend from Littlefield 
visited with her. Rodgers’ 
wife, Nilah, writes for the 
“ Readers’ Digest" Maga­
zine.

Lucy Cantrell is back in 
the Nursing Home after a 
brief stay in the hospital.

• •  • • •
Visiting with Docia Pa­

rish Monday was her 
daughter,  Ona Higgins. 
Her son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Eldon Parish visited her 
Friday night .$

Bulah Connell went to 
the dentist with her dau­
ghter. Ethel Sanders,  her 
g randdaughter  and her 
great • granddaughter ,  
visited last weak.

• • • • •
Visiting with Dr. Mc­

Daniel was his sister, Mrs. 
Eldon Faust; his nephew, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Mc­
Daniel; his daughter,  Mr. 
and Mrs. Largent; and 
Mrs. Stephens,  Dr. Mc­
Daniel 's office nurse for 
many years. Mrs. Bird­
song came by to see him 
also.

Joe Stone visited the 
Nursing Home several 
times this week.

• * •  • *
Mrs. West  was visited 

by her sister.
* * * * *

The Nursing Home Staff 
attended an In Service 
meeting on 24 hour chart­
ing Tuesday. The meeting 
was held in the hospital. 

* * * * *
Lela Ann Smith, Judy 

Sawer and Jean Treadwell 
went to Plainview Thurs­
day to visit a Nursing 
Home and look at their 
charting.

Tom Watson was visited 
by his family and Joe 
Stone.

<

W hile 
Supplies | 

_  _ Last
25-FT.
POWER TAPE
High-impact styrene 
case. Positive toggle 
lock holds tape firmly. 
Black markings on yel 
low steel tape. Self

Willie Steinbock was 
taken to the dentist by his
son Wednesday.

* * * * *
Mrs. Shanks is sitting 

with Mrs.  Patterson in her 
room. Mrs. Patterson was 
visited by her family this 
week.

Ed Parks is improving 
daily. He is now out visit­
ing and attending activi­
ties.

• * • • •
Edna Henderson has 

completed several more 
blocks on her Dutch Girl 
quilt this week.

Onnie McDaniel has 
painted two oil paintings 
and decoupaged a plaque 
this week. She was visited 
by her brother,  Claude 
Garth of Canyon and her 
cousin, Florence Harvey of 
Clovis.

Task force requests
radiation exposure reduced.

REGIONAL VARIETY STORE CHAIN

With 134 Stores Located All Over Texas 
We have Openings For

MANAGER - TRAINEES 
and

ASSISTANT MANAGERS
WE^OFFER:

Generous Starting Salary - 
Training Program -  Paid Vacation - 
Life & Hospital Insurance -  
Retirement Program -  Paid Holidays 
Employee Discount on Purchases -  
Five -  Day Work Week

Excellent O g o rtunit dvancement

CONTACT: Carson Clayton 
128 Main

Muleshoe, Texas 272-46201

€ 'o p e c ia //y /
l o r -

O f .

Built In 
KDC 18

*378°°
Installation 
& Delivery 

Not Included

KitchenAid
Convertible-Portable
KDI-58
SAVE

Moiras 
m

May 13

» KitchenAid 
Stainless Steel 
Disposers
KWS-200 or KWI-200
SAVE

KitchenAid
Trash
Compactor
KCS-100B
SAVE

KitchenAid
Because it's worth it.

Wilson
271-5511 Appliancein; main
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The Church is Cod's appointed agency in this world 
for spreodmg the knowledge of His love for man and 
of His demand for mon to respond to thot love by 
loving his neighbor. Without this grounding in the 
love of God, no government or society or way of life 
will long persevere and the freedoms which wo hold 
so dear will inevitably perish Therefore, even from 
a selfish point of view, one should support the Church 
for Jhe toko of tho welfare of himself and his family 
Beyond thot, however, every person should uphold 
and participate in Hie Church becouse it tells the truth 
about mon t life, death and destiny, the truth which 
alone w ill sot him free to live as o child of God.

The craftsmanship and artistry that 

has gone into the production of many 

bibles duel humbly honor God's 

word This work is a reflection 

of men s appreciation and 

love for God Many commit God's 

word to memory and their heart

Attend Church and study God's word.

1895 Forage Harvester w ith corn head

Will Be Available To Answer 
Questions On Any New Holland 
Forage And Hay Equipment

1112 Speedrower” Windrower

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE
Ninth and Ave. C 
Pat Ridley Pastor

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH
130 W. Ave. G.
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.

LATIN AMERICAN 
METHODIST MISSION
Ave. D and Fifth Street 
R.y. Chavez, Pastor

THE COMMUNITY CHURCH
H.D. Hunter, Pastor 
Morton Highway
CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
James Williams, Pastor 
1733 W. Ave. C

PROGRESS SECOND 
BAPTIST CHURCH
Clifford Slay, Pastor 
1st and 3rd Sundays

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH
Rev. David Hamblin 
507 West Second, Muleshoe

ST. JOHN LUTHERAN
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor
Sunday School Classes 
10:00 a . m .
Worship Services 
11:00 a .m .

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH
621 South First 
Elder Bernard Gowens

MULESHOE CHURCH OF 
CHRIST
David Cox, minister 
Clovis Highway

JEHOVAH WITNESS
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Minister

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH
Father Timothy Schwertner 
Northeast of City in Morrison 
Edition

MULESHOE ASSEMBLY OF
GOD
517 S. First 
Rev. Joe Stone

EMMANUEL BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Iglesia Bautista Emmanuel
107 E. Third
lsaias Cardenas. Pastor

RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST 
CHURCH
17th and West Ave. D 
Roy L. Sikes, Pastor

SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION
Rev. Ynes Aleman 
East Third and Ave. E. _ r

TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCll'
314 Ave. B 
Rev. Gene Prevo

LONGVIEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Pastor B.C. Sronecipher 
ph 946-3413

ST. MATTHEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH
West Third 
E. McFrazier, Pastor

SIXTEENTH AND AVENUE D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST
Sunday-10:30 a.m.
Evening-6 p.m.
Wednesday-8 p.m.
Terry Bouchelle, Minister

PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH
Progress, Texas
Rev. Gearld Albers, Pastor

NORTHSIDE CHURCH OF 
CHRIST
117 E. Birch Street

SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD'
East 6th and Ave. F 
Rev. Hipolito Pecina

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE 
CHURCH
207 E. Ave. G 
George Green, Pastor

MULESHOE BAPTIST 
CHURCH
8th Street and Ave. G.
Bob Dodd, Pastor

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
220 West Ave. E.
Rev. J.E. Meeks

ROBERT GREEN INC.
Your Oldsmobile, GMC, Pontiac, 

Buick Dealer
W. Hyvy. 84 272-45884

ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE WESTERN DRUG

114 Main

WATSON ALFALFA

272-3552 272-4038

MULESHOE 
C O -O P  

GINS

WHITES CASHWAY 
GROCERY

402 Main
"Where Friends Meet and Prices Talk"

WESTERN SPRINKLERS 
INC.

ZIMMATXC
W. Hwy. 84 
272-4544

BRATCHER MOTOR 
SUPPLY

ST. CLAIRS
110 Main

107 E. Ave. B 272-4288

DENT— REMPE 
IMPLEMENT CO.

John Deere Dealer _ _____
Muleshoe 272-4297

Dairq 
Queen

Margie Hawkins, 
^  Manager

272 3412

M AIN  STREET BEAUTY 
SALON

115 Main 272-3448

Compliments of

STATE LINE IRRIGATION
Li tt lefi e Id-Mu I eshoe- Leve I land

MULESHOE 
PUBLISHING CO. MULESHOE BODY SHOP

Muleshoe 272-4536 402 N .ls t 272- 4246

YOUR CHOICE
ATTEND THE CHURCH 

OF

SENIOR HORSE TEAM...WInning the right to compete In the atnte Ronnd-np at 
College Station In June ,  were member* of the Bailey County 4-H Senior Horse Team. 
They are, from left, Casey Farmer,  Sharia Farmer  and Shane Claunch. Not pictured 
Is Perry Flowers, fourth member of the team.

what is happening to our 
prime farm land. Is it 
becoming yet another 
speculative commodity for 
the investment portfolio or 
are our natural resources 
being used to produce food 
and fiber for American 
consumers?”  Butler con­
cluded.

No autobiography is 
what it ought to be.

TFU Disappointed In Death 
Blow To New Land Bill
A spokesman for the 

Texas Farmers Union says 
it was Governor Clements'  
announced intention to 
veto a proposed bill to 
prohibit foreign land 
ownership of Texas farm 
land that killed the mea 
sure in the House of

Newsnochs

Boyle s sr s

Guests in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Elwood Aut­
ry Sunday afternoon were 
their son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Mitch Autry, Marsha and 
Amy of M uleshoe.

* • • • •
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Nich­

ols visited their son and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Nichols at Dell City last 
week. The Nichols then 
spent the weekend with 
their other son, Mr. and 
Mrs. Donnie Nichols at 
Canyon.

Mrs. Loretlo Jones and 
Wendell spent Saturday to 
Monday with her son and 
his brother, Mr. and Mrs-. 
Robert Jones at Nocona. 
They also*\rtSTreTf~her new 
grandson,  Bradley Keith.

•  •  •  *  •
Mr. and Mrs. H.H. 

Snow of Muleshoe were 
guests in the home of her 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. J .W.  
Layton, Thursday.

• • • • •
Rev. and Mrs. Charlie 

Shaw received word that 
their daughter,  Mrs. 
James Crocker of Tucum- 
cari, N.M. was in the 
hospital.

• » * * •
Jarrol Layton and Rich­

ard Nichols went with the 
Three W ay School on their 
senior trip to Corpus 
Christi last Sunday. They 
returned home Wednes­
day.

•  • • • •
The Bula • Enochs'  

Lion’s Club sponsored a 
covered dish supper at the 
Community Center Satur­
day night.

Representatives Wednes­
day.

Clements publicized his 
intent to veto HB 431 just 
prior to lawmakers'  deci­
sion by 72 to 67 to table the 
proposal, a vote which 
Farmers Union says is 
"another clear indication 
that the oil companies are 
writing the laws of Texas 
once aga in.”

"The  record of public 
testimony in committee 
and the well known facts of 
who the opposition was on 
this issue obviously made 
it a big oil versus small 
farmer choice for the legis­
la ture, "  said Ron Butler, 
State Secretary of TFU. 
"Two of the large multi­
national energy firms 
which are not based in the 
U.S. led the charge and 
the rest of the ‘oil gang'  
followed.”

Efforts of the general 
farm organization will now 
center on a bill to require 
registration of land hold­
ings in the state by both 
foreign and domestic in­
vestment corporations. 
Whether the opposition 
will be as heavy and 
whether Governor Cle­
ments will again threaten a 
veto afe not known.

Quipped Butler, "Since 
the f f -n* '  1 title cenrern 
about exported petro - 
dollars returning to buy up 
our Texas farm land... and 
considering the onetime 
interest by foreign royalty 
to purchase the Alamo...  I 
wonder how state officials 
would react to putting up 
the Governor’s mansion 
for sale to the highest 
foreign bidder?”

"F or  those who.say there 
is no problem, we chal­
lenge the legislature to 
reconcile its position with 
the states '  farmers and 
ranchers by passing a 
strong disclosure law. 
Such a measure should not 
overlook the giant real 
estate investment corpora­
tion... foreign and domes­
tic. Let’s find out who 
really owns the land in 
Texas and what trends are 
evident in current t rans­
actions.”  he continued.

“ We need to measure

G R E G G  4 5  M

M IC R O N A IR E
From Late Planted Cotton!

•77 Bales of GREGG 45M grown in Swisher 
county, planted June 9-19 after hail out- 
M IC R O N A IR E  A v erag e  4 .0

•farm ers have 
MIKES on their G 
20.

reported all PREMIUM 
IREGG 45M replanted June

•In 1977 (a good cotton year) first bolls opened 
were picked, ginned, and miked-oo mike 
above 4.9

•GREGG 45M will be consistentlv batting lor 
the PREMIUM MIKE

•For planting in the northern areas, and tor 
late plantings.

•By all means try some of our GREGG 45M 
when planting after bail outs, washouts, and 
sand outs.

GREGG SEED 
FARMS, INC.

2700 Loekney Highway 
Plainview, Texas (806)296-7902

The
Sandhills

Philosopher
Editor 's note: The Sand­

hills Philosopher on his 
Johnson grass farm on 
Sandy Creek seems un­
alarmed about the state of 
the nation this week.

Dear editor:
There is a tendency 

among some people to be-, 
lieve the United States is 
incompetent,  or, to put it 
another way, less com­
petent  than other major 
nations.
‘In fact, according to a 
recent poll -- if you be­
lieve polls are competent-- 
two-thirds of the people 
think we are in "de ep  and 
serious trouble.”

W hatever the situation is, 
you shouldn’t get the 
notion we’re alone.

For example,  according 
to an official news report in 
the Russian government 's  
own newspaper,  the only 
kind they have over there, 
"40 percent of the Soviet 
work force will be too 
drunk or too hung over 
every Monday morning to 
put in a good day’s work."

That 's  what I'd call being 
in deep and serious 
trouble.

What I want to know.

however,  ia who did the 
pollsters interview to find 
out that two-thirds of U.S. 
citizens think we are in 
deep trouble? Were anv 
prospective candidates in­
cluded?

I have seen few candi­
dates,  now or in the past, 
who did not claim we are in 
serious trouble and the 
only way to get out is to 
elect them. Aftei they get 
in and we are still in 
trouble they then claim the 
only way to get out is to 
re-elect them.

The world rarely solves 
its problems.  It mostly just 
passes them around from 
one party to another or 
from one system of 
government to another. 
You can ’t tell how drunk a 
man is by the form of 
government he is living 
under.

According to some people 
the world has been on the 
brink of disaster ever since 
a brink was discovered.

I do not know how seri­
ously we’re in trouble but 
you can not make me 
believe that once we have 
got all these cars produc­
ed we are not going to find 
something to run them 
with, or that once we have 
got all these buildings with 
windows that won’t open 
we are not going to find 
some way to air-condition 
th e m .

Yours faithfully, J.A.
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Deadline For Classified Ads Is At 11:00 
Taesdays Aad Fridays

HOUSE FOR SALE: One 
year old, 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, 1440 sq. ft., S39.000. 
Call 272-3439 after 4 p.m.
8-17s-tfc

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion, 

per word --S.11 
Minimum Charge -- 

$1.80

2nd Insertion, 
and thereafter 
per word •• $.09 

M In Imam Charge 
SI.SO

CARD OF THANKS 
25 words -- S3.00 

Over 2S words 
charged at regular 

classified rates 
Classified Display • • 

S1.S5 per column Inch 
Double Rate for 

Blind Ads. 
DEADLINE FOR 

INSERTION 
11 a . m .T u e s . f o r  Thurs.

11 a .m . Frl. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 
RIGHT TO CLASSIFY, 
REVISE OR REJECT 
ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 
AFTER AD HAS RUN
ONCE.

8.
•*<

REAL ESTATE

MOVING...
MUST SACRIFICE.. .

3 bedroom, 2 bath,  brick 
home with large, panelled 
living room, fireplace, 
covered patio, privacy 
fence, storage shed, 2 car 
garage, plus many-extras.  
Call after 6 p.m. -  272- 
4737.
8-18t-4tp ____________

KREBBS 
REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C 
P h . 272-3191 

All Your Real Estate 
Needs.

APPRAISALS
8-18t-tfc_______________

HOUSE FOR SALE: 11/2 
lot, 904 Hickory, 2 bed ­
room, large living area, 
brick, fenced yard, garage, 
storage building. Call 925- 
6737. Will show by ap­
pointment only.
8-7 t-tfc

1. PERSONALS

For Tour ALUE VEKA |  
PRODUCTS See Doris |  
Wedel,  224 W. 2nd. Call |
272-3332. ■

5ss-

udderth Realty, Inc.\

5ss-tfc

Box 627 109 5th St
Farwell. Texas 79325 i

Phooa (8061 4B1 3286 or 461 9149 1

I
| All on 2 Acres, beautiful | 
j 3 bedroom, 2 bath,  brick J 
| home, double garage,  | 
I lots of storage, addition- i 
I al.

A COMPLETE LINE 
OF

KOSCOT COSMETICS 
CALL

MRS. GLENN SPLAWN 
272-4871

1 -1 7s - tfc

W E B U Y
USED FURNITURE A 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
1-18s-tfc

WANTED: Babysitting in 
my home. Hot meals and 
play area provided. Call 
272-3570.
1- 18s-2tp

2. LOST AND FOUND

LOST: At New City Park 
during Easter egg hunt on 
Saturday, April 14, one 
Kodak pocket camera with 
strap. $20 reward offered. 
Contact Polly Otwell • 272- 
4536, days, or 272-3163 
after 6 p.m.
2- 16t-tfp
*••••*•*••••***••«**•••*•*••
3. HELP WANTED

MAKE SPARE MONEY if
you knit, crochet, embroid­
ery or sew and would like 
to make spare time money. 
Contact Charlies, 109 S. 
1st. or Call 272-5180.
3- 14t-tfc

WANTED: Persons be­
tween the ages of 20 and 
40 interested in a paid 
training course for nurses 
aides being offered at 
Muleshoe Nursing Home. 
Selected applicants will be 
paid during the training 
program, and after suc­
cessful completion of train­
ing course will be eligible 
for employment at an 
annual salary in excess of 
$6,000.00. Must  be able to 
read and write English and 
be able to work any shift. 
Apply In person at Mule- 
shoe Nursing Home.
3-18s-2tc

HAIR STYLIST NEEDED:
at Muleshoe Beauty Salon. 
Call Betty Oliver at 272- 
3258 or 272-3639.
3-18s-4tc

I

I Double garage,  corrals,
I small good 3 bedroom , 1 
I bath house, lots of e i-  
I tras, have to see to 
J appreciate,  West  of 
J Muleshoe.
J 8 -1 4 s - tfc

RICHLAND HILLS HOME
FOP SALE: Excellent lo­
cation across from school. 
Brick, 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 
baths,  den with fireplace, 
carpet and panelling like 
new. Lots of storage, 
double garage and fenced 
backyard. Call 272-4391. 
8-5t-tfc

160 Acres, irrigated, 
N .W . of Earth,  1/2 min­
erals.
1312 Acres, N.W. of 
Bovina, 1/2 minerals. 
1700 Acres. S.W. Knox 
City, Haskell and Stone­
wall Counties, 1000 
Acres grass,  balance 
cultivated, some miner ­
als.
960 Acres, West  of La- 
mesa, in Gaines County. 
279 Acres, East of Dick­
ens,  166 acres cultivated 
land. A real buy at $250, 
1/4 m inerals.

ALTON HESTER 
806-763-0993 

Clint Hicks- Broker 
806-799-4486 

Lubbock, Texas 
8-18s-2tp

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath house. Fully carpeted 
and drapes,  double car 
garage and patio. 310 W. 
16th or call
272-5179 after 5 p.m. or 
296-2361 In Plalnview, col­
lect.
8-18t-tfc

IF YOU MAKE $16,000 or 
less a year and have a good 
credit rating you can quali­
fy for a new FmHa home. 
Contact J&R Construction 
about their FmHa approv­
ed homes.  Call 272-3758 or 
272-4347.
8-50s-tfc

For all your real estate needs 
Call:

GLAZE & GOFORTH 
112 Ave. C 
272-4208

8-11 s-tfc

N [ B 1 N T f t W N ,  BEAUTIFULNEW
M . t  " ” J "  ' . n d  HOME FO» SALE
earn extra money selling ^ 2 5  W Ave. j ,  cer .m.n
quality A v o n  products.  For tile entry, large l.v.ng -
details,  call 272-3208. duung room, k.tchen
 ̂ oo 7t breakfast,  den 3 large

J l _ ................................  bedrooms and 2 full baths,
HAIRDRESSER NEEDED fireplace. bookcases,
Full or part time. Apply at »fches- Amana se,f clean
The Honeycomb. Phone « rema *°p s , ° 7  ‘
272-5108 large pa,l° ’ plus th- |7  . * features too numerous to

, * s list. For appointment  call
............... ................*..................  272-3183.
5. APTS. FOR RENT 8-l3s-tfc
oooooooooooooooooaaaaa* ..................................................
......................... ........................ • HOME FOR SALE: 3 bed-
FOR RENT: Three room roonii 2 bath,  central heat
unfurnished apartment ,  an(j a jf) | a rge corner lot,
adults only. Call 272-5132. $35 900.00. Call 272-5061.
S-14s*tfc 8-16s-tfc

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE 

272-4838 
232 Main Street

New 3 bedroom, 2 bath 
brick homes in Richland 
Hills.
Country Club Addition,
3 bedroom brick home,
1 and 1/2 bath.  Small 
down payment.
Close to 3,000 square 
feet of floor space, 3 
bedroom, 2 1/2 bath,  2 
fireplaces, central air 
and heat. A lot of house. 
We also have 2 bedroom 
houses.

Three bedroom, two and 
1/2 baths,  large 2 car 
garage,  brick house. 
;Has sprinkler system, 
{underground.

FOR COMPLETE 
REAL ESTATE 

SERVICE 
CONTACT 

JOE AND RICKY 
SMALLWOOD

*8-14s-tfc

RICHLAND HILLS 
HOME 

BY OWNER
3-2-2, fireplace, built • ins, 
sunken den, garage door 
opener,  fenced yard, corn­
er lot. 1,800 sq. ft. Call 
272-4617.
8-10s-tfc

H IG H W A Y  2 1 4  NO RT H

M U L E S H O E . TEX AS

TOWN and
COUNTRY

R E A L  E S T A T E
8 unit Apartment  com­
plex

3 bedroom stucco house 
with fireplace and single 
garage.

1 Acre rural home sites 
on pavement ,  some 
O.K. for mobile homes.

3 bedroom, 2 bath,  all 
carpet,  built-in appli­
ances,  edge of town. 
Highway 214 North.

3 bedroom brick, 2 
baths,  double car gar ­
age, Country Club Addi­
tion, possession at clos­
ing.

FARMS RANCHES HOMES

JOHN W. SMITH,

Broker
806-272-4678

or
272-4307

8-17t-tfc

FOR SALE: Home in 
Country Club Addition, 
902 Juniper.  Pay owner 
equity and assume low 
interest loan - 8 3 /4% .
Call 272-4191 for appoint­
ment ,  Immediate posses­
sion.
8-16s-tfc

FOR SALE: Small well 
improved place by high­
way, out of town, will 
finance, Call 272-3719.
8-1 St-tfc

FOR SALE: New 3 bed­
room energy efficient brick 
home, 1 car garage,  1 3/4 
baths,  wood fence, by J&R 
Construction. 707 Ave. J. 
8-50s-tfc

ROBERT RICHARDS 
REAL ESTATE 
111 W. Ave. B 

272-4581
Yonr Listings will 

be appreciated

U\E.nnet(i ezff. cH e.nr\j

Equal Housing 
Opportunity 

272-4228
8-16s-tfc

We want your bnslnesa 
“ REMEMBER” 

REID REAL ESTATE 
THURSIE REID 

272-3142

Nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath,  
fully carpeted,  storage, 
storm cellar, good loca­
tion.
8-18t-tfc

9. AUTOMOBILES FOR SALE

The Trustees of the Mule­
shoe Independent  School 
District is offering for sale 
by SEALED BID the fol­
lowing vehicle:
I • 1956 Chevrolet Van 

May be inspected at the
school warehouse between 
8 a.m. and 5 p.m.,  Mon­
day through Friday. Bids 
will be opened Monday,  
May 14, 1979 at 8 p.m . The 
Board reserves the right to 
reject any and all bids in 
the best  interest  of the 
District.
9-17t-4tc

FOR SALE: 1975 Buick Le 
Sabre -  34,000. White 
over blue, tires like new, 
AM/FM radio. Call 272- 
4696.
9-  18s-3tc

10. FM. EQPT. FOR SALE

FOR SALE: 1969 40-20 LP- 
clean; 15 foot Tandem 
disc: 35 Ferguson tractor; 
7030 John Deere; 200 - 2 
inch tubes; 100 - 1 1/2 inch 
tubes;  disc ditch filler. Call 
965-2997.
10- 17s-4tp

11. FOR SALE OR TRADE 
a***************************

FOR SALE: 17 foot arrow- 
glass Cheeta boat with 
inboard engine. Call Chap­
man Supply Co., 272-3473.
II -15t-tfc

FOR SALE: AKC Dalma 
tion pups.  Call 806-262- 
4181.
11- 17t-4tp

FOR SALE: Peanut,  Candy 
and Gum vending business 
in Muleshoe,  requires 
$1,435.90 cash and a few 

, hours weekly. Texas 
Kandy Kompany,  1327 
Basse Road, San Antonio, 
Texas 78212, Include tele­
phone Number.
11-17t-4tp

FOR SALE: 1972 Interna­
tional Semi - truck, 1964 
Mack truck, 1965 Mack 
truck, Grain truck bed. 
Call 272-3043.
11-17t-tfc

FOR SALE: One male 
Pekingnese - $25.00, one 
female Poodle, $25.00. 
Call 225-6351.
11-18s-2tp

12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS

FOR SALE: Stereo - AM/  
FM radio, 8 track and 
turntable,  2 • 14 inch
speakers • $65.00. Call 
272-4144 after 5 p.m. 
12-16s-thp

BURROWS UPHOLSTER­
ING* new address,  118 W. 
Ave. C in the rear. Phone 
272-4255
12-39s-tfc

FOR SALE: Baldwin Bravo 
Organ. Double keyboard, 
bass pedals,  muted reed. 
Call Beverly at Journal 
office, 272-4536.
12-15t-tfp

r *
BOAT STORAGE

Locked inside dark stor­
age, by month or year. Call 
272-3330.
15-49s-tfc

15. MISCELLANEOUS

ELECTRICAL WORK: Reason­
able rates, jobs large or small. 
Jerry Teaff Electric.
Phone 933-4659, Bula
15 3lt-tfc

RENTAL SERVICE
Washers,  dryers, televi­
sions, refrigerators. By 
week or month.

Call 272-5531 
WILSON APPLIANCE 

117 Main
MULESHOE, TX.

15-51 s-stfc

FOR SALE: 
WATERLESS 
COOKWARE

Home demonstration kind. 
Never opened. $175.00, 
Normally $400 - $500. Call 
1-303-591-1331.
15-17t-8tp

CUSTOM HOME - 
ADD ON • 

REMODELING 
CALL

J & R  CONSTRUCTION 
272-3758 

OR
272-4347

15-14t-tfcn ------------------------
I Custom Designed 

and
Made-To-Order 

R1NGS-N-THINGS 
BY JEROLLY
918 E Hickory

Phone 272-3163

West Plains 
Medical Center! 

Report
ADMISSIONS.. .
April 30 — Mary Dell Snell, 
Leo Ruvalcaba, Monica 
Reynolds, Commie Blain,

116 Livestock
FOR SALE: Now milk­
ing. 3 nannies -• 3 and 4 
year old registered Nu­
bians.  Also, 30 month 
old registered Nubian 
buck; 5 month register­
ed Nubian buck, Cadil­
lac line; and grade Nu­
bian Doeling, 2 months 
old. Call 272-3378.
16-18t-4tc

Terry Burton, Marty 
Guire.
May 1 -- Robert Johnson,  
John L. Taylor, Dalia Or­
tiz, Minnie Raymond, Do­
rothy Seaton.
May 2 -- Jake Tunnell, 
Alfonso Mendoza,  Ruth 
Myers, Maggie Patterson. 
May 3 -  L.J. Spears.

DISMISSALS...
April 30 -- Tommie Nel­
son.
May 1 -- Randy Johnson,  
Galma Hubbell,  Toby 
Hatch, Monica Reynolds. 
May 2 -- Robert Jo hn ­

son, Juan Gutierrez, Ter­
ry Burton, Dalia Ortiz, 
Kevin Smith, Marty Mc­
Guire, Roman Reyna.
May 3 •- Commie Blain, 
Dorothy Seaton, Gene 
Davis.

ON SACCHARIN
WASHINGTON -  The 

American Council on Science 
and Health says saccharin 
poses no proven human health 
risk and should not be banned 
on existing evidence. The 
council’s interpretation is that 
since there is no proven hu­
man risk, saccharin should be 
considered safe.

Singleton-Ellis Funeral Home
24 Hour Ambulance Service 

Ph. 272-4574 Muleshoe

TV & APPLIANCE 
SERVICE 
All Brands 

Specializing In 
Zenith,  Magnavox,

W hlrlpool,
Kitchen Aide &

Maytag Appliances 
Also Antenna Work 

Service within 
24 hours of call 

WILSON APPLIANCE 
117 Main 
Muleshoe 
2725531

15-18s-stfc j
V » » » » 4 > » 9 9 a » » n

WANT TO BUY 6 or 8 inch 
Irrigation Pumps.  Phone 
894-7286, Levelland.
15-18s-4tp

ASPHALT ROOFING 
COMPOSITION 

SHINGLES 
new roof and repairs. 

Free Estimates.
Call Collect 
Ron Fosbee 

385-5680
LITTLEFIELD ROOFING

15-16s-tfc

RENT A NEW 
25”  COLOR T.V. 

MAGNAVOX 
Mediterranean Cabinet 

Phone 272-5531 
WILSON APPLIANCE 

15-51 t-stfc

* • • • •
He will not have a 

barren mind who knows 
how to bear in mind.

ferti-lome 1

ferti-lome
ROSE FOOD
CONTAINING SYSTEMIC INSECTICIDE

Systemic 
action goes 
directly into 
the root 
system 
and works 
throughout 
the entire 
plant.

CONTROL APHIDS 
ON YOUR ROSES

& ferti-lome &

i r i s '
1 0 3  M ain 272-4552

U o e o
Industries Inc.

F ~~ Farm Update 78 
by

Mr. Farm er
You Should Own Your Own Grain Storage 

System.

1. You can control your grain to obtain maximum price benefit.

2. You will receive the storage cost.
3. You will receive the "In and Out”  charges.
4. You will have a valuable asset in your system.

5. You will receive depreciation allowance on your system

6. You will receive investment credit on your system.

7. You can avoid slow-downs at harvest and reduce field loss.

8. You can have increased harvest efficiency because of better 

utilization of trucks and combines.
9. With the TAGC0 Grain System, and care in harvest and storage 

management, a superior grain product can be obtained, which is

worth more in the market place. Your grain can demand a premium price.

10. You can market your crop for delivery in the future at a rate of 

delivery to suit your coustomer's needs. Be your own middle man.
11. TAGC0 can assist you in a grain marketing program as part of our 

customer service program.

All Of These Benefits llsuallly Add Up To A 2 to 4 Year Payout.

Tagco Industries, Inc.
P.O. Box 1921 
Hereford, Texas 79045

806-357-2222
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Hog Feeds Checked For Sulfa Residue
ed from another source.

"Another  source of con­
taminat ion," Armstrong 
says, "comes from hogs’ 
eating manure that was 
dropped by sulfa • con­
taminated hogs in trucks, 
buying stations, packing 
plants, and other places on 
the way to marke t .”

* *  • • •

Mr. and Mrs.  Rodney 
Travathian from Amarillo 
spent  the weekend with his' 
parents,  the S.G. Longs.

• • • •  •
Mr. and Mrs.  Marvin 

Long of Amarillo spent the

first part of the week with 
the S.G. Longs.

• •  • • •
Melissa Green of Lub­

Several from the com­
munity at tended the fune­
ral of R .L. Reeves • in 
Lubbock Tuesday.

•  • * • •
The annual Maple Gin 

Co-op meeting was held 
Thursday night in the High 
School cafeteria. Dinner 
was served and several 
door prizes were drawn. 
Three directors were elec­
ted and dividend checks 
were given.

“ The problem comes,” 
Armstrong explains,
"w hen  the producer feeds 
a sulfa contaminated with­
drawal ration that he be­
lieves is sulfa - f ree . "  This 
contamination can come 
from feed-mixing equip­
ment,  on the farm or in a 
commercial  mill, that was 
not adequately cleaned fol­
lowing its use to mix sulfa- 
mdeicated feeds. It can 
also come from producer's 
mixing clean feed with 
sulfa-contaminated feed 
ingredients,  such as pro­
tein supplement,  purchas­

sulfa contaminated feeds 
or water.

With the limited number  
of feed samples taken to 
date, about 10 to IS pe r ­
cent have sulfa levels that 
could cause violations. 
While there is no connec­
tion between the feed 
sampling program and tis­
sue sampling at packing 
plants, reports show that 
of all hog carcasses check­
ed at the packing plants, 
from 10 to 15 percent have 
violative sulfa residues.

Hogs must be off sulfa- 
medicated feed at least 15 
days before slaughter.

Sulfa residues are show­
ing up in hogs from farms 
where the producer uses 
no sulfa, he points out.

"Consequent ly,  samples 
are being taken from these 
farms as well as from 
farms where sulfa is used, 
since the program is aimed 
at helping producers pin­
point the contamination 
sources. Samples are also 
being taken on farms 
where feed is farm-mixed 
and on farms using com­
mercially mixed feeds,"  
Armstrong adds.

Hogs with more than 
one-tenth part per million 
sulfa residue in their car­
casses at slaughter may 
not be sold for human 
consumption. Residues re­
sult when hog* consume

A program to help pork 
producers detect sulfa re­
sidues in withdrawal ra­
tions is now into its third 
month. Dr. James  M. 
Armstrong,  veterinarian 
with the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service, 
Texas A&M University 
System, reports.

"F ee d  samples are being 
tested from 60 hog farms 
in Texas, as well as 780 
farms in nine other states. 
The samples are being 
collected by Extension per­
sonnel and others in major 
pork producing states.  Be­
fore the program ends this 
summer , it is estimated 
that at least 4,000 farms 
will be sampled in about 20 
s ta tes,”  Armstrong says.

The Three Way Seniors 
and their class sponsors,  
Mr. and Mrs. W.C. Eu­
banks and Mr. and Mrs.  
Caton Tyson spent the past 
week in Corpus Christi.

• • •  • *
Mr. and Mrs.  George 

Tyson spent  Thursday 
night in Lubbock with their 
daughter ,  the Tommy Dur- 
hams.

• • * • •
Mrs. Darrell Robertson 

.of Haskell spent  the past

He said producer co­
operation has been excel­
lent in providing feed
samples.  The program is 
aimed at helping hog pro­
ducers spot potential prob­
lems before they find
themselves in violation for 
having excess sulfa in their 
hogs.

bock spent  the past  week 
with her grandparents,  the 
Jack Furgesons.

*  *  •  *  •

The community received 
a good rain Sunday night 
with amounts varying 
throughout the area.

Mr. and Mrs. Trov Tv- 
son and children of Level- 
land were dinner guests in 
the George Tyson home

"Each of these advertised items is required to be 
readily available for sale at or below the advertised price 
in each store, except as specifically noted in this ad. 
We reserve the right to limit quantities. None sold to 
dealers.'1
Prices Good May 6 thru May 12

■ ■  Double Stamps 
jW |  Every Wednesday

WOMEN’S SECOND PLACE.-The Plalnvlew women's
volleyball team sponsored by Strain and Dunaway 
Garage In Plalnvlew placed second In a tournament 
held April 26, 27 and 28 by the Gymnastic Boosters 
Club. Pictured, from left to right, back row, Georgia 
Proctor, Sally Phillips, Vickie Francle, and Helen 
Klllham, front row, Helen Gullagber,  Snsan Thomas 
aadNataUo Nolloy.

Be satisfied with Piggly Wiggly 
Meats or D ou b le  Your Money Back!

We give Double S 4 H Green Stamps every Wednesday with 
any purchase of $2 50 or more (excluding beer, wine and 
cigarette purchases)

Charmin
Bathroom Tissue

Chicken1 
of Tho Sea Limit 4 Pkgs. With $10.00 

Purchase, Thereafter 59* Lb,

rt Limit 2- 
4 Roll Pkji. 
Hisrsoftir 

if * 1.12  ossli.WOMEN’S THUD PLACE...Third place wlnnora In
the Gymnnatlc Boosters volleyball tonrnament  held 
April 26, 27 and 28 were the First National Bank team 
of Mnleshoe. Pictured, left to right, back row, Lela Ann 
Smith, Jeanet te  Precnre and Mini Ellis; front row, 
Dianne Weldebnsh,  Beverly Slxemore and Eva Nell 
Stovall. Nat pictured la Carolya Stavaaa.

Frabrie 
4 Softener

MEN’S THUD PLACE...Tha Playbaya from Morton
placed third In the m en ’s division of the Gymnaetlc 
Booster Volleyball Toarnament  on April 26, 27 and 28. 
Second place winners was the Gordon Wilson 
Appliance Team .

Piggly Wiggly Grade A

A Representative 

from Dow Chemical Co.
i

will be present to present 

information and answer questions 

concerning N-Serve.

Be present
for this informative Program

Limit 3 Doz., 
Thereafter 79* Ea

Be satisfied with Piggly Wiggly Produce or D ou b le  Your Money Back!

When-Tues., May 8, 7:00 a.m. 

Where-Corral Restaurant 

(Buffet breakfast will be served ) 

Why-MAKE DOLLARS

ReJ, Rips Juicy, Ctiffomit

Strawberries
Quart Baikal

Potatoes u
Excellent fir Sammir Salad t 
Rad t  6f .«  #
Leaf Ltthiei d

Baker
Farm Supply, Inc,

Farmer Jones

S ffe e s t^ M
B aeo n ^-m

\

1:
1 8

l M. Pkg.
USDA Heavy Western Beef ^
Blade CutChuck Roast 1 i * «
USDA Heavy Western Beef
Bone-In * Full-Cut JSbfc.Round$teak̂ *&1 l 8 «


