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Local Youth Participate

F o r e m a n  C om pan y
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BAILEY COUNTY JOURNAL
The Com m unity O f Opportunity- W here Water Makes the D ifference  ’

SPECIAL AWARD PRESENTED—Tuesday morning Greg P. Hemphill, sales representative for 
the Procter and Gamble Distributing Company, was in Muleshoe and presented a plaque to the 
Muleshoe Nursing Home. Jim Swanner, administrator, accepted the Caring Practice Facility 
Award. Pictured, not in order, Hemphill, Maria Flores, Helen Free, Joy Stancell Candy Reyna 
and Jim Swanner.

Muleshoe Nursing Home 
received the Attends Caring 
Practices Award for 1985-86. 
This award, given through 
Procter and Gamble's Attends 
Proffessional Education Pro­
gram. is given in recognition of 
the facility’s commitment to 
staff education and training in 
incontinence management and 
skin care.

Thursday morning Greg P. 
Hemphill, sales representative 
tor the Dallas based company, 
was in Muleshoe and presented 
one of five plaques he will be 
presenting in this district, which

AROUND
MULESHOE

extends as far east as Mineral 
Wells and northward Into Okla­
homa as well as west Texas.

"Only a select group of 
facilities nationwide receive the 
Caring Practices Award, whose 
goal is to assist long-term care 
facilities with on-going staff 
training and education pro­
grams.”  Hemphill said. “ The 
program provides Attends Reg­
istered Nurses to educate the 
nursing home staff on incontin­
ence management and proper 
skin care.

Muleshoe Nursing Home is 
licensed for 57 residents and at

present there are 40 residents. 
They HaVe " 1 “ total of 36 
employees including Jim Swan­
ner, administrator; and Joy 
Stancell, activity director. They 
also have a dedicated group of 
volunteers who are available to 
help the residents wheather it is 
shampooing their hair or enter­
taining them with games.

Swanner and the staff of the 
Muleshoe Nursing Home are 
proud of the nursing home and 
the care they give their resi­
dents. The public is always 
welcome to go by and visit and 
see the special care given to the 
residents.

July 4th Plans Well Underway
Take your father out to the 

Putt Putt Golf Course today. 
Sunday, and he can play putt 
putt free for Father’ s Day, 
according to Joyce Holmes, 
manager. ***

The Palo Duro Hospital Care 
Unit is planning an Impaired 
Nurse Support Group in the 
Amarillo area. Anyone interest­
ed in becoming a part of this 
group is asked to call the Care
Unit at 806/655-7723, collect.

***
Sgt. Charlie Simmons of 

Plainview stated, “ In Bailey 
county, our troopers investigat­
ed no fatal accidents, three 
personal injury ac idents, and 
one property damage accident 
in the month of May. No 
persons were killed and three 
persons were injured in these 
accidents.

***
Alpha Zcta Pi will be hosting 

the ‘ Kid’s Day’ events for July 
4th again this year.

They will begin at 10 a.m. at 
the Bailev County Civiic Center 
for all children, ages I -10.

More information on the 
types of events and specific age 
groups will be released as July 
4th draws nearer.*♦*

v
Sudan will hold their 4th of 

July parade on Saturday, June 
27 at 3 p.ni. and all antique car 
owners are encouraged to enter 
their cars.

Capt. L.A. Reinhart. District 
Supervisor o f the Lubbock 
Highway Patrol District com­
prising of 21 counties said. “ For 
the month of May, troopers 
investigated several fatal 
accidents, 56 personal injury 
accidents, and 57 property 
damage accidents. There were 
nine persons killed and 56 
persons injuicd it1 these acci­
dents

Toni Eagle, manager, said the 
Muleshoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture is pre­
sently planning a big celebra­
tion for the Fourth of July. On 
the Third of July, a miniature 
golf tournament is scheduled at 
the Mule Putt Miniature Golf 
Course; an antique car race, 
traveling coast to coast, will be 
shopping at Muleshoe in the 
afternoon, and merchants are 
urged to hold sidewalk sales all 
day.

Tentative plans also are being 
made to hold the monthly MAC 
Buck drawing on July 3rd.

On July 4th, the day will 
begin early with a 7 a.m. 
registration for the 10-K and 
2-mile run. At 8 a.m., the run 
will start at KMUL Radio at 600 
West Eighth Street. Registra­
tion will be $8 for all runners. 
Entry forms may be obtained 
from the CoTC.

Registration for the World 
Championship Mule Shoe Pitch­
ing contest will begin at 8 a.m. 
The actual competition begins at 
9 a.m. Entry is $5.

Divisions for the contest are 
men's, women’s, doubles, child­
ren and youth. Competition will 
last until a woi! 1 champion has 
been determined. Contact the 
Chamber for more details.

At 10 a.m. the Civic Center 
will open with kids activities, 
booths aivd entertainment.

The CofC is now reserving 
booth space for the celebration. 
"W e arc expecting a large 
crowd this year for many 
reasons.’ ’ said Mrs. Eagle, 
and hope mis turns out to be 
profitable for all concerned."

Booths arc available at the 
Civic Center from 10 a.m.-2 
p.m. and at the city park from 5 
p.m.-IO p.m. Cost for a booth is 
$15 and for a booth at both 
locations, the cost is $25.

Mrs. Eagle explained that 
this money will be used to 
secure entertainment, pay for

In Farwell Tournament

Nursing H om e Receives

- _______________________________

Activity Committee

Plan Busy 

July 4  Weekend
The Muleshoe Activity Com­

mittee has made plans for a
busy July 4th weekend. Starting 
the weekend off will be the 
MAC buck drawing on Friday, 
July 3 at 2 p.m. at the corner of 
Main and Avenue C. Eight
hundred dollars will be given 
away. The first drawing will be 
for $150.00 in MAC bucks, with 
the second drawing being worth 
$250.00 in MAC bucks. The last 
drawing for the day will be for 
$400.00 in MAC bucks. MAC
bucks may only be spent in
Muleshoe at participating MAC 
buck merchants. You must be 
present to win.

Also on July 3 MAC is 
sponsoring a Putt-Putt tourna­
ment for individuals. There will 
be two divisions, Adults and 
Juniors, 15 years and down, 
w ith proof of age being present­
ed to officials at sign up. Two 
janies must be played to 
ctermific the top five for play 

offs. Games start at 6:30 to 8 
p.m.

Adult division entry fee will 
be three dollars. Prizes are first 
place, Munsing Wear Golf Bag; 
second place, Munsing Wear 
umbrella; and third place, 
Munsing Wear golf shirt. Prizes 
may be seen at Anthonv’s.
Cont. Page 6, Col. 4

Summer basketball league 
play will begin tomorrow, Mon­
day, June 22 at the Farwell 
High School Gymnasium with 
games scheduled on Monday, 
Tuesday, Thursday and Friday 
of each week, except July 3 and 
6, and will continue until July 
27 A league tournament will be 
held from July 28 thru July 31.

Games will be played by 
federation rules except that 20 
minute halves will be played 
instead of eight minute quar­
ters. “ There will be no volun­
teer officials”  said Duke Kirk­
land. Summer League Director. 
“ All officials will be paid on a 
per game basis. Games will be 
officiated just as you would 
have them officiated during 
your regular season. Any player 
who receives a technical foul 
will be ejected from that game 
and if the same player 'should 
receive a second technical foul

concerned about the number of 
players each team has as there 
will be several gone during 
parts of the summer.

T-shirts will be given to 
players on their first night of 
play. For further information or 
questions you are asked to 
contact Duke Kirkland at 481 - 
9513.

Team members include: 
HAWKS

Bone Nicolas, Jeffrey 
Stewart and Darron Haseloff all 
of Farwell; Matt Brogden and 
Brian Brogden of Friona; Bret 
Taylor of Clovis.

Also Byron Martin and War­
ren Martin of Texico; Greg 
Garcia, Frank Precure, Brad 
Long and Scott Miller all of 
Muleshoe.

BULLETS
Donald Rubio, Michael Aree 

and Lance Castleberry of Far-
r , , well; Cody Burney and Darren

during the course of league play Proctor 0f Friona; Billy Scott
then he will be suspended from q..aa. . „ u c.___
futher play

"Each team will have a 
coach. He will be responsible 
for the team's actions. All 
players will be given a reason­
able amount of playing time. 
Coaches will get in touch with 
their team before league play 
begins.

“ The teams have been divid-

Sudderth and Randy Stone of 
Bovina.

Also Gerald Kinanek and 
Shawn Roach of Clovis; Wes 
Jarman and Sergio Gonzales of 
Muleshoe; Jim Allen of Lazbud-
dic CELTICS

Abel Lopez, Michael Lovett 
raittV Monte Dolgado qf Farwell; 
Scott Scaff and Manuel Porras

ed as evenly as possible under Bovina; Brian Rogers. Pete 
the circumstances. However, Fuentes and Lilo Perea of 
I’ m sure we will see strong as Texico.
well as weak teams. Again, the 
purpose is to enhance your 
basketball abilities and not to 
dwell on your team winning or 
losing."

Plavers are asked not to be

Postmaster Asks Citizens Help

fireworks, buy trophies and 
countless other items needed to 
have a celebration such as July 
4th.

Booths are reserved on a first 
come, first served basis. The 
fee is due when the booth is 
reserved. Each booth renter is 
responsible for your own tables 
and equipment used, as well as 
clean-up of your own area.

At 2 p.m. the meeting room 
of the Civic Center will be open 
for the annual Old Settler’s 
Reunion.

Cont. Page 6, Col. 1

Federal Land Bank 

Lowers Interest Rates
Officials of the Federal Land 

Bank of Texas today announced 
plans to extend their new fixed 
rate, purchase money loan 
program.

Favorable response to the 
Land Bank's fixed-rate loan 
program in May prompted the 
bank to initiate Phase 11 of the 
to initiate Phase II of the 
program. Phase II offers quali­
fied purchasers a 9 3/8 percent 
interest rate for the purchase of 
farms and ranches and a 9 5/8 
percent rate for the purchase of 
rural residences. Each program 
has a I point closed loan fee to 
the bank.

“ The bank's Executive Com­
mittee reviewed the overall 
benefits of the program and 
determined that the program 
would be beneficial to our 
stockholders by helping stabilize 
the rural land market in 
Texas.”  says Don Rogge, presi­
dent of the Federal Land Bank 
of Texas.

Rogge noted that during the 
first 30 days of the program. 
298 applications totaling $47 
million were submitted to

Local postmaster Abel 
Arguello has emphasized the 
need for citizen involvement 
in helping the local Post Office 
from burglaries and vandalism. 
“ Eventhough postal funds are 
secured in a safe, burglars who 
are unsuccessful in attempting 
to break into a safe will 
sometimes steal mail left in 
customer’s post office boxes”  
according to Arguello.

“ Even when they don’ t steal 
mail, they sometimes just cause 
malicious vandalism. In either 
event, it does cost the Postal 
Sevice money to repair the 
damage incurred and for the 
Postal Inspectors to conduct an 
investigation. Our local tax 
money is also spent by our local 
law enforcement officers who 
incur expenses, because they 
arc usually the first agency to 
respond, and they also provide 
valuable assistance in the inves­
tigations to the Postal Inspect­
ors.

‘ ‘ But the most important 
reason for citizen involvement is 
because it causes a hardship to 
those whose mail is stolen or 
destroyed as the result of a 
burglary or a senseless act of 
vandalism”  said Postmaster 
Arguello.

Texas and Oklahoma continue 
to be the target of post office 
burglaries, according to Postal 
Inspector in charge, D.C. 
Strader, Fort Worth. Strader, 
whose area of responsibility 
includes the northern half of 
Texas (north of Austin) and all 
of Oklahoma, said that over 50 
burglaries will occur within the 
boundaries of the Fort Worth 
Division this year if the current 
trend continues.

Most of the burglaries have 
oecured at post offices that are 
located in rural communities 
that have limited or no local law 
enforcement available for 
routine patrols at night.

“ A majority of the burglaries 
do not involve the loss of postal 
funds, because very little money 
is kept overnight in post offices 
and postal stations. Safes and 
security containers are used to 
secure the money and blank 
Money orders which are kept

Also Daniel Echols of Friona; 
Chad Waddell and Steve Sando­
val of Muleshoe; and Donnie 
Holt of Lazbuddie.

KN1CKS
Dustin Hardage. Sammy Her­

rera and Damon George from 
Farwell; Pat McBroom from 
Lazbuddie; Omar Sanchez and 
Eddie Zamora from Muleshoe 

Also Conrad Johnson o f 
Clovis; Tony Vega of Texico; 
Matt Fox, Hippy Gomez and

continually adding and updating % ^ iccnte_  M°noz from Bovina; 
existino alarm f ue»«mc Rusty Rainey and Chuch Sutter

overnight”  stated Strader. “ In 
addition to burglary-resistant 
security containers, we are

existing alarm systems where 
appropriate. However, we need 
for the residents of each city, 
town, and community to help us 
protect their post offices and 
Stations from huralnripc and 
vandalism.”

Residents can help reduce 
burglaries and vandilism by 
reporting suspicious activity at 
or around the postal facilities 
which occurs after business 
hours. This activity would in­
clude such things as auto­
mobiles or trucks with license 
plates from outside the local
Cont. Page 6, Col. 3

of Friona.
LAKERS

Jeff Actkinson, Greg Act- 
kinson and Kirk Fly from 
Farwell; Denver Riddle and 
Kenny McLaughlin of Bovina; 
John Cass of Friona.

Also ixiese Hand, Darren 
Proctor and Larry Powell all 
from Texico; Ronnie Perez. 
Brett Pvlant and Doug Chitwood 
all from Muleshoe.

WARRIORS
Michael Day, Clint Cole and 

Curtis Chisom all of Farwell;
Cont. Page 6. Col. 2

RECOGNITION AWARDS PRESENTED---Thursday morning 
Abel Arguello. postmaster, presented special recognition awards 
to Jack Glover. Sylvia Benachneu and Melvin Griffin These 
employees of the local Post Office didn't use an\ sick leave 
during 1986. Griffin has saved a full year of sick leave over the 
past years.Cont. Page 6. Col. 5
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DA VII) DALE SEATON

David Dale Seaton 
Funeral Services 
Held Saturday

Funeral services for David 
Dale Seaton. 9, of Lazbuddie 
were held at 3 p.m. Satur­
day. June 20 in the Lazbuddie 
Methodist Church with Andy 
Rogers, Church of Christ minis­
ter from Antlers, Okla., officiat­
ing, assisted by the Rev. Larry 
Reed-Farris, pastor.

Interment was in Lazbuddie 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Ellis Funeral Home of Mule- 
shoe. He died at Parmer County 
Community Hospital at Friona 
after falling from the back of a 
pick up two miles East and two 
and half miles North of F.M.

Bert Davis

Local Man's 
Step Father Dies

Funeral services for Bert 
Davis, 74, were held at 2 p.m 
Sunday, I June 14 in the 
Colonial Hill Baptist Church 
with the Rev. Miller Robinson, 
pastor, officiating. Masonic 
graveside rites were conducted 
at 4:30 p.m. at Rule Cemetery 
under the direction of Bell- 
Cypert-Seale Funeral Home.

Davis died Friday at Cogdell 
Memorial Hospital.

He was born on Aug. 23. 
1912, in Haskell and was a 
member of Colonial Hill Baptist 
Church. He was a retired gin 
manager and has been a Mason 
for 55 years. He had been a 
member of Scurry County 
Masonic Lodge 706 and the 
Shriners.

Davis was a former board 
member of the Plains Coopera- 
'ive Compress and Oil Mill at 
Lubbock and the Rolling Plains

214.
Born Feb. 17, 1978, in

Muleshoc, he had lived at 
Lazbuddie all of his life. He was 
a fourth grade student at 
Lazbuddie Elementary School 
and a Methodist.

Survivors include his parents, 
Jimmy Dale and Rickie Seaton 
of Lazbuddie; grandparents, 
Jimmie and Tink Seaton of 
Lazbuddie and Dixie Barnes of 
Friona; two sisters, Sherrie 
Nichols of Lazbuddie and Barbie 
Seaton of Amarillo; a brother, 
Jeffery Seaton of Lazbuddie.

We are offering a comic book that stars the same cartoon 
character that appears on all of our television safety spots.
We cal! him “Sparky the Safety Mouse." This is a light-hearted 
approach to a very serious subject: safety. We want to give 
children a safety message they will read, understand and 
remember. This is the time when youngsters are most apt to 
be playing around power lines. So, it’s the best time for them 
to think about sSfety. Pick up your free comic book now.

In all S P S  offices and many children’s stores.
We want you 
to play safe

C'tPt

SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE COMPANY

Here's a fun way to 
learn about safety.**

Sparky the Safety Mouse Comic Book

PCA. He has served as manager 
of the gin at Loop for 17 years 
and was named “ Ginner of the 
Year”  in 1972, by the Tyxas 
Dinners Association. He MarC 
lied Edna Tomlin on June T, 
I960, in Snyder.

Survivors include his wife, 
Edna; a daughter. Kay Logston 
of Stamford; two step-daught­
ers, Loretta Hewitt of O'Brien 
and Patsy Covey of Snyder; a 
stop-son, Jerry Beasley of 
Muieshoe; four grandchildren; 
one great grandchild; seven 
step grandchildren; four step 
great grandchildren; one sister, 
Willie Mae Whitmire of San 
Antonio; and two brothers, 
Allen of Rule and Hollis of 
Dallas. He is the grandfather of 
Mrs. Larry (Jerria) Free and 
Allen Beasley of Muieshoe.

Golden
Gleam s

He that rewards flattery begs it.
-Thomas Fuller.

Flatterers look like friends, as 
wolves like dogs.

-George Chapman.

Immaculate Conception 
Catholic Church
Father Patrick Maher 
Northeast of City
First Baptist Church
220 West Ave. E.
Byrrv Bradley, Pastor
Emmanuel Baptist 
Church
Iglesia Bautista Emmanuel
107 East Third
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor

Trinity Baptist Church
314 E. Ave. B.
Rev. V.L."Buster”  Huggins

Primitive Baptist Church
Corner of Ithaca St. and 
Fir Ave.
Elder Glen Williams, Pastor
Circle Back 
Baptist Church
Intersection FM 3397 & FM 298 
946-3676
Calvary Baptist Church
1733 W. Ave. C.
Rev. Darrel Martin

Primitive Baptist Church
621 South First
Elder George Johnson, Pastor

Muieshoe Baptist Church
8th and Ave. G.
Bob Dodd. Pastor

Progress Baptist Church
Paul Brigham, Pastor 
Progress. Texas

Richland Hills 
Baptist Church
17th and West Ave. D.
David McAdams, Pastor
St. Matthew 
Baptist Church

Tomer of West Boston &
Vest Birch
d.S. Brown, Pastor
Progress Second 
Saptist Church
1st and 3rd Sunday 
Clifford Slay, Pastor

John Chappel is visited every­
day by his wife and grandson, 
Jeremey.

***
Margaret Beard was visited 

by Josic Flowers Tues. after­
noon.

***
Mildred Nieman had out of 

town relatives visiting her last 
Thurs. Her husband and daugh­
ter visits her at least once a 
day.

***
Cordelia Cochran was visited 

by Jewel Strong Tues. Her 
nephew Troy McKillip visited 
her also.

***
Lena Hawkins, J.E. Embry 

came Thurs. to play 42 and 
Skip-Bo with the residents.

***
Ella Faubus was visited by 

her daughter Dorothy and 
daughter Johnnie.

*** ,
Our thanks to the Truth 

Seekers S.S. class of the First 
Baptist Church for their dona­
tion to our activity fund.

■ v w s » w w w w  ■

ommunity
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ome

Is pleased to announce 

the opening of its

Muieshoe

ealth
We are an agency that cares about you and the people 

close to you.
We realize that illness is often easier and more positively 

dealt with in fam iliar home surroundings. It is also less costly than 

long term hospital care.
Our agency brings together the services needed and 

delivers them to your home under the direction of your personal 
physician and a skilled nurse.
For information concerning how we may be of assistance to you, 

Please call one of the Local Representatives.

Judy Jacobs RN 272-4845 Carol Delaney RN 272-5661

kfcmi •* l -* s, -

' ^ 1

§|j
'J-V*
m
l i

kV“t" ■-fr—
U s

super highways, these interlocking cloverleafs ol shiny 
concrete that crisscross our land are an amazing marvel ol our nation's 
engineering. And vet for all the time and inconvenience they save 
unless we know exactly where we are going they can become a con­
fusing "ia /e  a motorist s nightmare

W e can easily compare our lives to the automobiles that travel 
these highways. A driver without a known destination in mind, a 
motorist that does not know where he is going, a man w ithout a map 
or a guiding plan is soon lost amid the complex interchanges And so 
it is with life Each of us has but one true destination and that is 
toward God and His promise of Eternal Lift* The church, your church, 
is the guidepost that lights the way: it is the^ign on the highway that 
points ’ he. route. Give your life a known .est inatjon . . .  G o tô  t^g^ 
church o< your chblee ' * *  *

...... iftfcoi oo:,*- l.JL'.Ay ; 4i fj t>

Longview Baptist Church
965-3413
B.C. Stonecipher. Pastor
Primera Iglesia Bautista
223 E. Ave. E.

Lariat Church Of Christ
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00 & 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Services 7:00 p.m. 
Sam. Billingsley, Minister

I n . I * .  lin
h.jo«-i.f| , i* ii 4mU'«.|4 i.l..ill hi 'In • lii'HH !-.....

Muieshoe Church 
Of Christ
Clovis Hwy
David Allessandro, Pastor
16th & Ave. D. 
Church Of Chirst
Sunday 10:30 a.m. 
Evening 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday 8:00 p.m.

First Assembly 
Of God
Rev. David C. McCune 
9:45 Sunday School 
11:00 Morning Worship 
6:30 Evening Services 
7:30 Mid Week Services 
272-3017

Spanish Assembly 
O f God
East 6th and Ave. F 
Luis Campos. Pastor
First United 
Methodist Church
507 W. 2nd Muieshoe 
Richard Edwards, Pastor
El Divino Salvador 
Methodist Church
5th and Ave. D.
Jose. M. Fernandez, Pastor

St. John Luthem
Sunday School & Bible 
Classes 9:30 a.m. .
Church services 10:30 a.m.
Rev. Mac Bearss, Pastor

Templo Calvario
507 South Main 
Sunday 10:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 7:00 p.m. 
Evangelistic Services 
J.L. Soto, Pastor
United Pentacostal 
Lighthouse Church
207 East Ave. G.
Rev. J.A. Torres
The Community Church
Morton Hwy.
H.D. Hunter, Pastor

Jehovah Witness
Friona Hwy.
Boyd Lowery, Pastor
New Covenant Church
PLainview Hwy.
Sunday 10:00 a.m.
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.
Jimmy Lowe. Pastor
Church Of The 
Nazarene
9th and Ave. C.
Dennis Hayes. Pastor

hi
TIC

Western Drug
1 114 Main

Lenau Lum ber
202 t . Ash 272-4222

Dairy Queen
1204 W. American 272-3412 ^

Serv-All
Thriftway

i  401 W. American Blvd. 272-4739

Lindsey Jewelry
202 Main 272-3355

K em p ’s Discount  i j  

Furniture
414 W. American Blvd. 272-5023 |

:  Farmers Spraying 
Service

| Lazbuddie 965-2624

Foster Fertilizer
Lazbuddie 965-2921

F ry & CoInc. i ;

401 S. Jst 272-4511
| i

Main Street 
BeautySalon

'  115 Main 272-3448

Irrigation Pum ps 
& Power

West Hwy. 84 272-4483

Bratcher M otor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. D. 272-4288

K C  M uffler
1 .

'  201 North First *  Phone 806/272-36

*

B obo Insurance
108 E. Ave. C. 272-4264

F ive Area Telephone  
Cooperative In c .

302 Uvalde 272-5522 1

W est Tex 
Feed Yards

!  _ 272-7555

American Valley 
Inc.

Hwy. 84 W. 272-4266

Central Texaco
272-3915 ! 

221 W American Blvd. ]

t i i
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WELCOME TO MULESHOE--Rev. David McCune. minister of 
the First Assembly of God Church, and his family recently 
moved to Muleshoe. Rev. McCune and his wife, Beverly, have 
three daughters Christine. 16 and half; Candace, IS. and 
Camille, nine. Rev. McCune is_ a graduate of Southwestern 
Assembly Biblb College at Dallas and Southwestern Theological 
Baptist College at Fort Worth. Rev. McCune enjoys scuba 
diving, basketball, all sports and motorcycling while Mrs. 
McCune enjoys gospel singing, professionally records albums, 
speaking at women’ s gatherings, swimming and being a 
homemaker. *Vv. wish to give «  hearty welcome to the McCune 
family.

Henry Insurance

FA TH E R

K N O W S

That's still pretty accurate in describing the guy who 

works hard to give his fam ily the material things in life, 

finds the time to give the most important things o f all - 

his love - and is so concerned with the security o f his 

family that he finds the best banking advice and services 

offered around - and he uses them!

We at First Bank salute all the dads around this 

Father's Day, Sunday, June 21st, and hope that every dad 

will want to know that the best in financial guidance is 

given through the banking expertise here at First Bank.

) •  2 0 2  1 s t .
-----------

Member FJDJ.C. 272-4515

LOCAL GIRL PLAYS IN TOURNAMENT— Heather Hutton,
daughter of Mr. and Mrs Terry Hutton of Muleshoe 
participated in the A.A.U. State Tournament in Clovis, N.M. 
recently and will play in the National Competition early in July 
in Clovis. She is the granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Damron and Mr. and Mrs. Horace Hutton, all of Muleshoe.

Photo by Joe Kusek,
_______________  Clovis News Journal

Appraisals Improve Says 

1986 Tax Study

w w  v w  <m w *  w w  *  v  w  *  *  v  w ^ " w  w w w  w w w

Caribbean Hawaiian Shave Ice'
Over 6 0  Flavors To Choose From 

Frozen Yogurt 
Soft Drinks

1 - 1 0  p.m .
7 Days A Week 

Drive Up Window 
c Available

800 Blk W. Amer. Blvd.
| Owned & Operated By Dianne Nieman & Sons

Property tax appraisals in 
Texas were more accurate in 
1986 than in previous years,, 
according to an annual study 
performed by the State Property 
Tax Board (SPTB).

However, the agency's 1986 
Property Value Study also 
shows a 1.5 percent drop in the 
property tax base of Texas 
school districts from 1985 to 
1986, led by a sharp decline in 
the taxable value of oil and gas 
reserves.

Accoring to the study, a 
typical property in the state was 
appraised at 93 percent of its 
actual market value on Jan. 1, 
1986. These appraised values 
formed the basis for 1986 tax 
bills. By comparison, tax 
appraisals were at a 90 percent 
level in 1985 and 81 percent in 
1983.

The study estimates the total 
taxable value of the 1986 school 
district tax base stood at $691.9 
billion, down from $702.3 billion 
the year before. Taxable values 
in 604 of the state’ s 1,062 
school districts were lower in 
1986 than the year before.

"Troubles in the oil and gas 
industry were the main reason 
for the drop in taxable value," 
said Ron Patterson, SPTB’s 
executive director. He' noted 
that the value of mineral 
reserves, mainly oil and gas, 
dropped by 26 percent from 
1985 to 1986. Industrial property 
and rural land also posted 
significantly value drops.

Patterson said the study’ s 
appraisal level findings indicate 
that most appraisal districts are 
doing a better job of appraising 
property. "Appraisals as a 
whole are getting closer to 
market value, and our figures 
indicate that appraisal levels for 
individual properties are more 
uniform,’ ’ he said.

Appraisal levels in 117 of the 
state's 253 appraisal districts 
were equal to or. better than the 
statewide level of 93 percent. 
However, appraisal levels in 24 
district were under 80 percent 
of market value, In addition, 
appraisals inclose to two-thirds 
of the districts were less 
uniform than those in the state 
as a whole.

SPTB completed its 1986 
study on May 26, 1987, after a 
three-month appeals process 
during which •** school and 
appraisal districts sought adjust­
ments to the study’ s preliminary 
findings.

"The Property Value Study 
performs two functions,’ ’ ex­

plained Patterson. "It provides 
a report card of sorts on the tax 
appraisals performed by county 
appraisal districts. It also 
estimates the taxable wealth 
available to each of the state’ s 
school districts, which is an 
important factor in determining 
the amount of state aid the 
districts receive for the 1987-88 
school year."

Patterson stressed that the 
1986 study reflects mineral 
values as of Jan. 1, 1986, before 
crude oil prices tumbled from 
$28 to $15 per barrel. "The 
taxable values of oil and gas 
reflect the present value of 
future income from the 
reserves," he explained. "In ­
vestors at the end of 1985 were 
already viewing the oil market 
as risky and offering lower 
prices for oil-producing proper­
ties. This perceived risk, as well 
as the ongoing depletion of 
reserves, were the main reasons 
for the drop in our taxable 
estimate.”

The uncertain oil market 
contributed to a slowing Texas 
economy during 1985. In addi­
tion. industry and agriculture 
were suffering from shrinking 
markets and falling prices for 
their products.

The market value of residen­
tial real estate, the largest 
single component of the school 
district tax base, grew by only 
ithree percent from 1985 to 
i960, the value of commercial 
real estate, on the other hand, 
grew by eight percent in the 
same period.

"Dur study tells us that, for 
most types of property, 
appraisal district are coming 
closer to meeting the standards 
that state law sets for tax 
appraisals,”  said Patterson. 
"The law requires individual 
properties to be appraised at 
market value, and mandates 
similar treatment for similar 
properties.”

For example, appraisal dis­
tricts appraised a typical single- 
family residence at 94 percent 
of its annual market value. For 
1985, the median appraisal level 
of these properties was 90 
percent. Other statistical meas­
ures in the study show that 
residences, like most other 
types of property, received more 
uniform treatment than before.

"These improvements may 
reflect better work on the part 
of some appraisal districts," 
Patterson observed, "in other 
cases, falling property values 
may have helped close the gap

between market values and 
aDoraised values."

Oil and gas reserves were the 
only type of property where the 
quality of appraisals deterior­
ated. The SPTB study indicates 
that these properties were 
typically appraised at 109 
percent of their market value for

Courthouse

News

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Michael Wayne Richards and 

Maria Mary Fredland, Mule­
shoe.

Eugene Robert Barber, Jr.. 
Clovis, N.M. and Karen Kay 
Kennemer. Muleshoe.

COUNTY COURT 
Ricardo Eugenio Barron, 

Order of Dismissal.
Randy Frank Hughes, DWI, 

$250 Fine, 1 Year Probation.
Gerald Wayne Lain, Order of 

Court.
Robert Wayne Lee, Motion to 

Dismiss.
Joe Luciana Gonzales, Motion 

to Dismiss.
DISTRICT COURT 

Bailey County Appraisal 
District ET AL VS. James W. 
Eubank, ET AL, Motion to 
Dismissal.

Estate of Eloise Gray VS. 
Jessie Gray, Motion to Dismiss.

Wooley International Inc. VS. 
Lionel Patterson and Carl 
Patterson, Individually and 
d /b /a  Patterson Harvesting, 
Order of Dismissal.

Larry E. Norris and Wanda L. 
Norris DV.

percent the previous year. "The 
uncertainty in the oil market at 
the end of 1985 probably made 
appraising these properties 
more difficult.”  said Patterson.

The Texas Property Tax Code 
gives property owners the right 
to protest the appraised values 
of their properties if they can 
prove that their properties are 
valued unequally compared to 
the median level of appraisal of 
other property in their appraisal 
district. "However," Patterson 
cautioned, "the appraisal levels 
shown in our 1986 study may 
not provide valid evidence for a 
taxpayer protesting a 1987 
appraisal, especially if the 
appraisal district has reapprais­
ed all property in 1987.”

Enochs News 
By: Mrs. J.D. Bayless

***
Mrs. Ellen Bayless was in 

Littlefield Wednesday morning 
and visited Mrs. Alberta Bryant 
drove back through Muleshoe 
and visited a sister-in-law, Mrs. 
Clara Coffman, a nephew and a 
niece. Jim Swanner and Helen 
Free, at their office’ s at the 
Nursing Home. She also visited 
Mrs. Blanche Aubry and Sheryl 
Waltrip who was there then 
visited Mrs. Olive Cox.

Mrs. Edward Crume visited 
in the home of Mrs. Etta Layton 
Sunday evening.

***

IMMIGRATION PHYSICALS

Adult 'S I 00

A.R. Partnar M.D.

5201 Indiana Lubbock, TX

8 0 6 -7 9 3 -5 8 2 4
Open

7 Days a  Week

9 a.m. - 9 p.m. Mon. - Fri.

9 a.m. - 1 p.m. Sat. & Sun.

Sunday, June 21st Is Father’s Day

q/amv FHHEK'S MY

B E S T !!
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Creative Living

Three interesting topics will 
be presented on “ Creative 
Living”  on Tuesday. June 23 at 
12 noon and repeated on 
Saturday. June 27 at 2:00 pm on 
KENW-TV. (All times are 
Mountain).

Sue Vaughn is tflL co-author 
of a very popular cookbook 
called Calf Fries to Caviar, and 
she will share some of her 
favorite recipes from the cook­
book. One is a stroganoff recipe 
that’ s made a little differently 
than most other stroganoff 
recipes. She’ ll also demonstrate 
a quick banana pudding that’s 
perfect for unexpected company 
or any meal that you want to be 
a winner every time it’s served. 
Sue is from Lamesa, TX.

Jean Benson has turned her 
sewing and craft talents into a 
very profitable “ cottage indus­
try”  called “ Critter Crafts", 
and she’s from Pasco, WA. 
Jean has also authored a Farm 
Journal Craft Book called Soft 
Toys to Stitch and Stuff, and 
one part of the book features 
patterns that are all made from 
circles. Jean will show how to 
make several different animals 
-  all using the same pattern. 
She calls these creations simple 
circle critters.

Did you know that we use 
more mustard seed in this 
country than any other spice? 
The show will open with a 
demonstration of a recipe for 
making you own mustard along 
with other tips on using this 
fascinating spice. Charlie Powell 
is a chef and restaurant owner, 
and he represents the American 
Spice Trade Association.

On Tuesday. June 23 at 9:30 
pm Zella Junkin, Director of 
Consumer Affairs for Wilton 
Enterprises. Woodridge, II. will 
show just how easy cake 
decorating can be. She explains 
that cake decorating combines 
creative fun with the satisfaction 
of baking and decorating home­
made cakes. She will show some 
of the basic techniques and also 
show a variety of specialty cake 
pans that add interest and 
excitement to the project.

Now anyone can microwave- 
blanch fresh vegetables and 
achieve 100 percent effective­
ness. Lauren Ryan, Director of 
Public Relations for Dow Con­
sumer Products, will show how 
to do this new technique -- and 
what a timesaver it is, too. 
Lauren is from Indianapolis, IN.

Three additional topics will be 
presented on the show on 
Thursday, June 25 at 12 noon. 
Furniture refinishing can be a 
difficult task, but Lynn Gerhart 
will demonstrate a new product 
that can make this job much 
easier and more fun to do. Lynn 
represents a company called 
QRB (Quickly Restores Beauty), 
and she will specifically discuss 
wood toners and stains. She 
lives in Boynton Beach, Florida 
and travels the country as a 
spokesperson for QRB. a pro­
duct her father created.

Another guest will be Joanne 
Wallace, President of Image 
Improvement, Inc. in Salem, 
OR. Joanne will discuss ward­
robe coordinating. She believes 
we need only two feet of closet 
space and thinks we should 
choose clothes in three colors

by Sheryl Borden
and build a wardrobe for 
everything you need based on 
these colors. She’ ll explain how 
to buy a thrift shops but avoid 
having a “ Second-hand store" 
look.

Many ex-housewives who are 
members of the business world 
will tell you the transition 
wasn't easy. Starting up a new' 
career takes a lot of confidence 
for any woman who hasn’ t 
worked in years. The show will 
begin with a segment on “ re­
entering the work force" -- a 
subject which, in the past 
decade, has involved over three 
million women between the 
ages of 35 and 54.

"Creative Living”  is pro­
duced and hosted by Sheryl 
Borden. The show airs on more 
than 95 PBS stations in the 
United States, Canada, Guam 
and Puerto Rico and is dis­
tributed by Pacific Mountain 
Network, Denver, CO. Viewers 
can request copies of printed 
materials offered on the show 
by calling on KENW-TV's 
toll-free telephone lines between 
8 am and 5 pm, Monday 
through Friday. In New Mexico, 
the number is 1-800-432-2361, 
out-of-state: 1-800-545-2359 and 
Portales and Roosevelt County: 
562-2112.

*****
WEDNESDAY NIGHT POKEP 

PARTY STROGANOFF 
(A winner every time)

2 lb. ground meat, 1 cup 
chopped onion, Vi tsp. salt, '/j 
tsp. pepper, 1 tsp. Monosodium 
Glutamate, 2 cups Cream of 
Mushroom soup, undiluted, 1 
carton sour cream, Frito corn 
chips

Cook the ground meat in a 
large skillet until all redness is 
gone. Add onion, salt, pepper, 
MSG and soup. Simmer about 
10 minutes. Just before serving, 
add sour cream. Serve this over 
Frito corn chips. Yield: 8 
servings.

QUICK BANANA PUDDING
1 box (3 5/8 oz.) Instant Vanilla 
Pudding, 1 can Eagle Brand 
Milk. 2 cups Cool Whip, Sliced 
bananas, Vanilla Wafers

Mix pudding according to 
package directions. Fold in 1 
cup Cool Whip and Eagle 
Brand Milk. Layer with vanilla 
wafers and sfiqe^ bandhas. 
Cover with remaining cup Of 
Cool Whip. Chill and serve.

**¥
Preference

A girl, filling out a form 
before going to college, 
came to the question: “ What 
is your denominational 
preference?” she wrote: “ I 
like to be called Belly.”

Bailey County Journal u s p s  m o  200
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The Bailey County Civic 
Center was the scene of a bridal 
shower honoring Miss I racy 
Stovall, bride elect of Dennis 
Huggins, Tuesday, June 16 
from 8 to 9 p.m.

Special guests included Linda 
Stovall, mother of the bride 
elect: Alice Huggins, mother ot 
the prospective groom; and 
Carol Dean Huggins and Minnie 
Ramin, grandmothers of the 
prospective groom.

Erma Leal served thumbprint 
cookies, homemade mints, nuts, 
and burgundy punch from silver 
and crystal appointments.

Mulcshoe Hobby Club met 
Thursday. June 18 at 2 p.m. in 
the Senior Citizens Complex 
with eight members present.

The hostess gift was won by 
Myrtle Chambless. The next 
meeting will be on July 2 with 
Ollie Cox as hostess.

Those present included: Polly 
Clark, Frances Bruns, Myrtle 
Chambless, Sammie Ethridge, 
Mattie Benson, Hazel Reeder, 
Glenda Morris and Blanche 
Aubrey.

The serving table was covered 
with a pink satin table doth 
with a burgundy lace overlay 
and accented with a floral 
arrangement in shades of bur­
gundy and pink with a votive 
spiral candelabra and burgundy ^
candles. The honoree’ s corsage 
consisted of dusty feather rose 
’carnations.

The hostesses gift was an 
Eureka vacum cleaner with 
attatchments. Hostesses for the

event included: Pam Prather. 
Margaret Copley, Laena W i | .  
Hants. Billie Downing. Lcla Ann A
Smith, Lawanna Stroud, Janie 
Mosely, Edith Lee, Helen Free. 
Erma Leal, Corine Malouf' 
Chubby Douglas and Charlotte 
Holt.

SMILES

Wrong Machine

Applying for his first 
accounting job the recent 
high school graduate was 
momentarily puzzled by a 
question on the application 
blank which read, “What 
mach incs can you operate?” 

Pausing briefly, he 
wrote, “-Slot and pin ball.”

T O P S

C L U B

Mulcshoe TOPS, Take Off 
Pounds Sensibly, club chapter 
No. 34 met at 6:30 p.m. 
Thursday, June 18 in the 
meeting room of Bailey County 
Electric.

Laverne James, leader, called 
the meeting to order. The TOPS 
pledge was recited and the 
fellowship song sung.

Jewel Peeler, weight record­
er, called the roll with 12 
members answering with the 
amount they had lost or gained. 
Minutes of the previous meeting

were read by Thresia Davis, 
secretary, and" they were 
approved as read.

Best loser for the week was 
Wanda Kemp, with Jackie Jean 
Whatley being First runner-up 
and Thresia Davis, second 
runner-up.

Rose Sain received a hair set 
for losing six consecutive weeks. 
This is her 12th week to lose 
consecutively. Nan Gatlin re­
ceived a gift from the birthday 
box and everyone sang happy 
birthday to her.

Thresia Davis received a gift 
from the club for bringing the 
program last week. She also 
read a topic on Heart Strings 
and The FAT Lady.

The meeting was closed with 
(he singing of the goodnight 
song.

■ Less Poynor's Sells I For Less Poynor s Less Poynor's Sells Fc

AIR CONDITIONER SPECIALS
179.99

sear me Hear INSTALL AIR C O N D I H O NIN G !

Save S30.00 
A. P ortab le  W bter Cooler. 2 s p e e d . 
2 5 0 0  C F M  R e g  S 209 99  (89-129-09)

Save $30.00 389.99
C. 4 2 0 0  C FM  W ater Cooler. 1/3 h p .
2 speed, horizontal discharge 
Reg $419.99 (89-130-48)
Not available <n stora* located n high humidity areas where 
evaporative cooling is entfticient Soma stores may require 
special order Check your local siora lor avaiiaoiiity

Save S90.49 
B. 4 0 0 0  C FM  W ater C oo ler. 1/3 h .p
2 s p e e d , h o r iz o n ta l d is c h a rg e  
R e g . $ 4 0  9  4 9  (89-i30-30)

(A)
shape vary

Save Money With An Energy Efficient 
Water Cooler From Champion!

’ ° r ,V e  M o t,

* Wa,er Shut.

V *

pa«#s

C°r>trols " UCn Wore ,

U 0 *

1.99 1 Per Ft.
[F loat Valve. C o n tro ls  
[w a te r le ve ls  in  w a te r 
(co o le r R e g  $ 3 1 4  

K* 40 349-48i

Tubing F au ce t 
a d a p to rs  25 ft tu b in g
R eg  S681 ,40.353-091

5 .99
E vaporative  C oo ler  
Pum p. 1/7 h p fo r 
c o o le rs  up  to 550 0  C F M
R e g  $8  91 <ao 375 03 i 

—

4s low  as 3 9 .9 9
1/3 H.P. M o tor For 
E vaporative  C oo lers .
R u n s  at 1725 r p m
■40 380-06r

B r a272*4552
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C o o ler C lean er. M ild  
a c id  c o r ro s io n  c le a n e r, 
pint Reg. 3.49
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'Attracting Retirees Could 
Boost Communities

The oldest “ baby boomer" 
turned 40 in 1986. which means 
that the median age of the 
nation's population will increase 
rapidly during the next few 
decades. I hat could directly 
impact many local communities.

•  “ With the retiree age group 
now the fastest growing seg­
ment of the population, 
communities might want to look 
at ways of attracting these 
senior citizens'," suggests Dr. 
Don Stebbins with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service, 
Ihe lexas A&M University
Sy s t em .

Projections suggest the num- 
•hcr of people in the 65 and 

older age group will be about 38 
percent of the nation's total 
population by 2030. That’ s a 
dramatic increase from 1970 
when this group represented 
only about 17 percent of the 
total population, notes Stebbins,
,i community development 
specialist.

'Retirees in the future will be 
0m ore mobile, better educated; 

and healthier; have higher 
incomes and more accumulated 
wealth; and be more active 
'consumers than past genera­
tions of re tirees ,"  Stebbins 
points out. “ Thus, attracting 
retirees to relocate may be an 
excellent economic development 
strategy for many Texas com­
munities."

0  Retirees don’ t want jobs and 
they bring experience, purchas­
ing power and potential invest- 
able funds to a community, 
notes the specialist.

“ Retirees' consumer needs, 
especially in leisure time activi­
ties. services, housing and 
medical care, arc frequently 
different from other age groups, 
hut this doesn’ t have to be a

Pros And Cons O f 

Bulk Meat Buying
Before purchasing a large 

quantity of meat, such as a side 
of beef, weigh the advantages 
and disadvantages. That low 

geost per pound of meat may 
mol be as inexpensive as it 
appears.

Dr. Alice Hunt, a nutrition­
ist with the Texas A&M 
University Agricultural Exten­
sion Service says, “ Bulk meat 
can be a goodftleal if YoU realiid 
what you’ re getting. If you 
don't enjoy stews, soups and 
hamburger, it might not be the 

ĝ iest buy for you.”
According to Hunt there is 

about a 15 to 20 percent 
difference between the adver­
tised carcass weight and the 
actual packaged weight. This is 
due to the removal of fat and 
some bone.

"The amount of each type of 
cut on a steer also may be 
deceiving. For example, of a

,000 pound steer, approxi­
mately 590 pounds will be 
carcass. Approximately 425 
pounds of that are retail cuts. 
Of those retail cuts, about 131 
pounds will be steaks, 126 
pounds will be roasts, 90 
pounds will be hamburger, and 
42 pounds will be stew and 
other miscellaneous m eats," 
says the specialist.

#  "D on 't  forget about the 
cutting and wrapping fees when 
figuring out if bulk is a good 
buy. Fees vary from place to 
place, and depend partly upon 
the size of the package request­
ed. Smaller cuts for smaller 
families cost more to wrap 
because of the added amount of 
materials needed. Larger cuts

I are a little less expensive, but 
fen ay not be practical for 

everyone," she says.

p rob lem ." says Stebbins.
Astute business men and 

women will react to these 
differences and turn them into 
economic opportunities.”

lexas already is an attractive 
destination tor retirees, the 
specialist points out. A recent 
U.S Department of Agriculture 
study identities the majority of 
nonmetroplitan Texas counties 
c'ast of a line for Del Rio 
through Fort Worth as retire­
ment counties. “ These counties 
had 15 percent or more net 
inmigration of people aged 60 
and over from 1970 to 1980," 
notes Stebbins, “ It’s not just a 
case of people retiring where 
they have lived and worked; 
instead, a lot of people have 
deliberately chosen to move to 
these counties."

On the other hand, some 
lexas communities cannot be­
come desirable destinations for 
retirees, and others prefer not 
to encourage inmigration for a 
variety of reasons.

“ However, the evidence is 
clear that parts of Texas already 
attract retirees. 1 believe more 
counties could benefit from this 
growing sector of our economy 
with aggressive marketing.”  
says Stebbins. “ As local leaders 
consider the economic direction 
of their communities, 1 recom­
mend that they give some 
serious thought to retirees."

Three-JF.iv 
News

by Mrs. H.W. Garvin

SPECIAL ENTERTAINMENT AT PARTY—Roy Whitt provided 
the entertainment at the Father's Day party held at the 
Muleshoe Nursing Home Friday afternoon. Hostess for the party 
included: Myrtle Puckett, Lona Embry, Joyce Turnbow, Shana 
Berry, baked eoblers, Joyce Morrison, Alma Crim, Mrs. John 
Chappell baked applesauce cake. Table decorations included a 
bandana tablecloth, a bale of hay, making up the centerpiece, 
and western.hat, boots, and boots full of Gourmet Pops.

Country Club Report
t  Marlene Martin

The Ladies Association of the 
Muleshoe Country Club met for 
their regular noon meeting, 
Wednesday, June 17th. A short 
business meeting was conducted 
by president Neats Foster.

Various committee reports 
were given. The Ways and 
Mean Chairman reported on the 
past money making project and 
that another project is 
scheduled for June 27th and 
28th.

Mary Holt, High Plains 
Director, reported the June Play 
Day -was rained out and the 
next regular Play Day would be 
held, July 8th in Clovis.

A report was given by Shirley 
Bean (hat a Fund Raising Golf

Tournament for the March of 
Dimes was to be held at 
Muleshoe Golf Club sometime! 
in August and asked for helo 
from the Ladies Association.

Play Day balls were presented 
for past Play Days. Thirteen • 
members formed teams and 
enjoyed an afternoon of playing 
in a golf scramble.

Members present were: 
Claudine Elliott, Jeanetta Pre-; 
cure, Shirley Bean, Marlene St. 
Clair. Lisa McElroy, Mary Holt, 
Melzine Elliott, Argilee Millen,
Dorothy St. Clair, Evelyn Riley. 
Marlene Martin, Leverne Winn, 
Helen Templeton, Neats Foster 
and Carelean Hamilton.

New Labeling Law Goes Into Effect

Rev. and Mrs. John Cockrell 
are visiting relatives in Jackson 
Miss. He is also holding a 
revival meeting in Jackson.

Mrs. Rayford Masten attend­
ed the bridal shower in Level- 
land Saturday honoring Cheryl 
McGoven bride elect of Wade 
Pollard of Whitherrell. Wade 
Pollard is Mrs. Mastens grand­
son.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Butch Tucker 
were dinner guests in the Bill
Dollc home Sunday.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Adolph Wittner 
and B.J. Emerson' were in 
Lubbock Saturday and had 
supper with the Roland 
Nitchers. Others attending were 
Mr. and Mrs. Baxter Vaughan 
from Plainview.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Morin 
from Morton visited Mr. and 
Mrs. George Tyson Sunday 
evening.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Dupler 
from Midland visited his mother 
Mrs. Minnie Dupler Sunday 
afternoon.

* * *

De-W interize Motor 
Homes, Travel Trailers

With vacation season at hand, 
it’ s time for RV’ers to de- 
winterize motor homes and 
travel trailers.

Begin by inspecting air and 
water vents and vent holes for 
“ dirt-dobber" nests, suggests 
John Cochran with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service, 
The Texas A&M University 
System. Look for bird, squirrel, 
mice and rat nests on top of the 
engine before starting. These 
could cause a fire or a bad smell 
to enter the RV.

Check for^insqcif nests clog­
ging carf>utrcto^ air “intake's, 
adds Cochran, an assistant 
agricultural enginner. Check the 
battery for signs of fire ants and 
the battery cables for corrosion 
or loose connections. If the 
battery is not a maintenance- 
free type, check the water level.

Look under the RV for debris 
or insect nests that could cause 
equipment failure. Examples 
include a plugged vent on the 
butane regulator, a plugged 
vent on the differential, or 
windblown paper around the 
muffler or exhaust pipe.

Don't forget to sanitize and

Irrigation Pumps & Power Inc.

-■-V Lindsay
Zimmatic Dealer

New And Used Pivot Systems 
For Sale

We Service All Brands Of Pivots 
Irrigation And Domestic Pump Service.

Earth 257-3855 Muleshoe 272-4483

purify the fresh water system, 
reminds Cochrait. Algae and 
bacteria can grow in a water 
holding tank and water lines 
that did not completely drain 
during last year’s winterizing. 
Bad taste and odors may result 
from a dirty tank, and a dirty 
tank could be harmful to health.

To disinfect the water tank, 
put a cupful of liquid household 
bleach into a full tank and leave 
for 24 hours, he suggests. Drain 
and fill with clean water. If the 
chlorine taste is still evident,
drain and fill again.

s f  •• -

W h o
K n o w s ?

1. When did the hurri­
cane season begin?

2. Name the flower for 
June.

3. Which president 
served the shortest time?

4. Name the author of “ I 
Hear America Sing.”

5. Define the word sobri-

4lKl' Answers to 
Who Knows

1. June.
2. Rose or honeysuckle.
3. William H. Harrison, 

one month— he died of 
pneumonia.

4. Wall Whitman.
5. An assumed name; a 

nickname.

Sulfites are often used as food 
preservatives, especially on 
fresh produce. People may be 
unaware of the presence of 
these sulfites, until an unfortun­
ate few experience allergic 
reactions.

Dr. Alice Hunt, a nutri­
tionist with the Texas A&M 
University Agricultural Exten­
sion Service says, "Asthmatics 
run the greatest risk of having 
allergic reactions to sulfites. 
Researchers estimate that be­
tween 5 an 10 percent of them 
are sulfite-sensitive. However, 
most people aren’ t affected."

The U.S. Department of 
Agriculture is working to help 
consumers become award of the 
presence of sulfites in fheir 
food. On July 9, the USDA’s 
new labeling law goes into 
effect. It requires all sulfites 
present at levels of 10 parts-per- 
million or higher be listed on 
food labels.

"S u lfites are most often 
added to produce and seafood to 
keep them looking fresh. They 
also are used in the processing 
of many foods, as ingredients 
in processed foods, and as 
bleaching agents,”  says Hunt. 
"M any baked goods, dried 
fruits, wines, beers, starches, 
fruit juices, pickled and frozen 
vegetables, syrups, and relishes 
contaiti some sort of sulfites. 
They may also be present in 
some types of medications.

"S u lfites include sulfur 
dioxide, sodium sulfite, sodium 
bisulfite, potassium bisulfite, 
sodium meta^lisulfite,, and 
potassium metabisulfite.

"Sulfites have been used tor 
centuries as preservatives and 
for types of food processing. To

this day, some' foods, such as 
dried fruit, could not be 
produced commercially without 
the use of sulfites. So the total 
ban of sulfites isn't feasible," 
Hunt maintains

Avoiding the dangers of 
sulfites is up to the individual,”  
she says. “ The new labeling 
law could make sulfites more 
identifiable, and they have been 
prohibited from restaurant use 
since 1986. Sulfite-sensitive 
people need to be very careful 
about reading labels before 
purchasing any food r medica­
tion, but there is no danger for 
everyone e lse /’ #

M ICROW AVE
CO O K IN G
By Linda Attaway

Microwave cooking can 
be more energy efficient 
than cooking with a con-, 
vcntional stove. Micro- 
waves cook faster and heat 
only the foods, not oven 
compartments or electric 
"eyes.”

The nutritional value of 
microwaved foods is usu­
ally greater than with con­
ventional stoves since less 
water is needed.

In the realm of safety,all 
microwave ovens made af­
ter 1971 are covered by a 
radiation safety standard 
enforced by the Food and 
Drug Administration.

To be completely safe, 
follow the manufacturer’ s 
recommendations for oper­
ating and never operate an 
oven if the door will not 
close firmly.

9Weac( 3nto Qutrn&i Ŵltl\ uAn
Sorting eAfew Sfoofcff

Com Jn Monday, June 22nd,
^ n d  Qet uA 9WaiA C utr

M  Styfe $27.50

Ana's House of Beauty
109 Ave B 272-4152

, 1 0 9 9 ^

SP E C IA L  SAVIN G S

Z E N IT H  Y M 6 2 0 0  Co~” ««ct V H S  
Cam corder with Auto-Focus 
s Lightweight, ultra-compact —  

weighs just 3.5 lbs., ready to 
shoot, with battery & cassette.

• Records k  plays up to one full 
hour on ;T l°-C  compact cassette?

• Plays tapes through the view­
finder, T V  or on standard VHS 
recorders, using a special adapter.

Z E N IT H  V R 1810. Cable compatibility, plus H Q  circuitry.
• 14-day/4-event auto-record timer.
• 108-channel tuning including up to 38 cable channels.*
• HQ circuitry for superior picture quality.
o Automatic power-on with automatic play feature, turns 

power on and begins tape play when cassette is inserted.
• Automatic rewind & play memory, rewind tape and 

cue for replay with the touch o f a button.
• Instant record.
• TV/ VCR remote control, operates both VCR & com ­

patible Zenith remote control TV.
*In Canada, 105-channel, 35 cable.

I V t f a o n , APPLIANCE, INC.
117 Main Street Phone 272 5531

M U LESH O E , T E X A S  79347

Get Away to Casual Luxury at the 
Most Exclusive Beachfront Condominium 

Resort on Galveston Island.

3%,

> All t .undos are Iteaehfmnt
> I tfflt'ieiu'les. I-J and A ll.lt. I ’nils
> Quirt l.m alion Away I rum ITaltir 

and ( .nil (inert ial I >rvrl< >|>mrnt
> St« it t< l| >r< x >t IX -sigi l
» I .urge I Iralrd Swim m ing Tool
> lint inti lai nz/.i Ovrrlt diking (inti on 

ITevaUtt I X'<k to A (lord I’rivat y With 
a S|X'<1a<iilar View

Two I .igtited Ifni list .mills 
Milt-sot Sandy lirath  .it NdurlXxir 
Only $ Minnirs loIXiw ntow nt ialvrslon 
Only k i  Minnirs I rom  I louston's 
l lobby Air|x>rt
on ly  a l r w  Minnirs to I'orl Holiday Mall, 
lioli. tisliing. s ra  Arania Marine Work I. 
Galveston s t abled I lisiorit Oisirit I. 
NigliK lul is and Restaurants

■ . . . — m m '  1---------------------------------------- -----------------------------------------

mm
* * * ; ; • ; ;

______________  m
-  - • 1 14 J pi

Sales Information or Reservations Call 409/763-6161

T h E G A U /K O IA N

1401 East Beach Boulevard • Galveston, I X 77530
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Lonnie McFarland- Don Gartin-John McFarland

A A U  Holds Basketball 
Tournament At Clovis

Several girls from the Mule- 
shoe League of Amateur 
Athletic Basketball Union parti­
cipated recently in the New 
Mexico State Championship 
Basketball tournament held in 
Clovis, N.M. Girls between the 
ages of 11 and 18 years, from 
all over the state of New Mexico 
and West Texas were eligible 
for this tournament. Five age 
divisions were represented from 
over 70 teams.

The Muleshoe League was 
represented by four teams, 
Muleshoe Bounders, 11 year 
and under age group, coached 
by Ricki Kelley; West Texas 
Rebels, 13 year old team, 
coached by Terry Field; West 
Texas Jets, 15 year olds 
coached by Darla Mutschler and 
Stephan Moore; and Lady 
Lakers, 15 years old, coached by 
Paul Stout, Andy Copley, Loy 
Triana and Don Warren.

Members of the Muleshoe 
Bounders team members 
included: Monica Clemmons, 
Stephanie Quintana, Lori Brad­
shaw (all star team) Misty 
Davenport, Nicole Alanis, 
Jessica Burch, Gail Copley, 
Brooke Sinclair, Natalie Stout, 
Gina Jarmon, Jodi Morris and 
Jenna Glover.

Those playing on the West 
Texas Rebels team were: Laura 
Alexander, Jill Foster, Micah 
Davis, Audrey Williams, Burn­
ley Riley, Jody Field, Chanda 
Kemp, Erin Kelley and Marsha 
Wilson.

West Texas Jets team includ­
ed: Tanya Fisher, Amber

July 4th
Cont. From Page 1

At 4 p.m., the parade will 
begin lining up at the Boy Scout 
Grounds for the 5 p.m. parade. 
This year’s theme is “ Born In 
The USA.”  To enter the parade, 
pick up an entry blank at the 
CofC office.

The city park will be the place 
to be at 7:30 p.m. The 4-H 
youth will host a concession in 
the park, or you can bring a 
picnic supper and join in the 
fun. Booths will be set up with 
different items for sale and 
again, to reserve a booth, you 
must contact the Muleshoe 

iChamber o f Commerce and 
Agriculture. Entertainment will 
'begin around this time,^ and 
continue until the fireworks 
display.

Class reunions are scheduled 
throughout the weekend, at 
different locations around town.

Green. Kelly Conklin, Mandy 
Stevens. Kristy Hargrove, 
Stacie Hodges. Wendy Green, 
Britt Engelking and Melissa 
Finch.

Shelby Ogden. Leah Hobbs, 
Crystal Cox, Laura Jean Patton, 
Michelle Stout, Lisa Triana, 
Christy Blanks, J.J. Harvey, 
Michelle Cox and Rose Mary 
Franco, are all members for the 
Lady Lakers team.

Other girls participating from 
this area were: Tory Matthews, 
Holly Morris, Brenna Matthews, 
Heather Hutton. Mia Jennings, 
Jana Brown and Debbie Isaac.

“ Due to the shortage of
volunteer coaches and officers 
there were several area girls 
who did not get to participate in> 
AAU Basketball this summer,”  
said Ricki Kelley. “ The Mule­
shoe League encourages volun­
teer coaching from anyone with 
knowledge and interest in 
women’s basketball.

“ According to state U1L rules 
each team is limited to a 
specific number of members. In 
order to involve more girls, 
Muleshoe AAU League must 
have more coaches to make next 
years’ program even bigger and 
better.”

Anyone interested in helping 
next year is asked to contact 
Terry Field at 272-3252 or Ricki 
Kelley at 272-5190.

Tournament
Cont. From Page 1

Keith Harrison and Hector 
Orozco from Texico.

Also Tim Lust, Jeff Hicks, 
Ivan Williams and Larry Gonzal­
es all from Muleshoe; Albert 
Trivino and Mickey Pena from 
Friona.

MA VERICKS
Steve Geries, Jaime Mendoza 

and Ruben Ortega all from 
Farwell; Byron Neal, Mike 
Bermea and Genero Ruvacava 
all from Bovina.

Also Lance Gatlin, Andre 
Duran and T.J. Sanchez all from 
Friona; Casey Bradshaw and 
Casey Russell from Muleshoe; 
Darrell Krivanek from Clovfs. 

ROCKETS
Brian Haseloff, Shawn Stew­

art and Stephen Ketcherside all 
from Farwell; Brent Riethmay- 
er, Steven Smith and John Ed 
Duke from Friona.

Also Brian Glover from Mule­
shoe; Steve Gauntt, Pete Quir- 
oga and Rav Estraca from 
Bovina; Brett Patrick and Benjy 
McDaniel from Texico.

Y ou  can  SA V E  on seeding costs by ordering your  

C onlee S eed  Hybrid Grain Sorghum  N O W ! Buy 3 bags 

o f your ch oice  o f  Hybrid Grain Sorghum  seed  . . . .  anc

G E T  TH E  4th B A G  F R E E !

All Hybrid Grain Sorghum s qualify

(M ay be M ixed and M a tc h e d !).

Quantities are limited - -

While supplies last.

BRAND
Wiedebush & Company

272-4611 1620 West American Blvd. Muleshoe, Texas

HatVest Hn\e

W e will p a y  the highest prices 

fo r  wheat this season
• Ample Storage For Your Wheat 

Is Available

• Service Is Our Main Concern

• Buying Generic Certificates

• Ready To Serve You  
This Harvest

Sherley-Anderson G rain Co.
Lariat, Texas

HONORING FATHERS ON FATHER S DAY -Friday afternoon 
all of the fathers at the Muleshoe Nursing Home were honored 
with a party in the day room. Joyce Gist was on hand to help 
her father, Ike Coffee, celebrate his special day. Fathers were 
given miniature jars of jam and red horse and western hat 
shaped Gourmet Pops.

Post Office
Cont.

area, unfamiliar people asking 
suspicious questions about the 
post office or amount of law 
enforcement patrol at night, or 
loitering in the post office box 
lobby or around the post office 
by groups or young people at 
night and on weekends when 
the post office is closed. This 
information should be reported 
to the local law enforcement 
agencies and to the postmaster 
or station manager.

Post office burglary is a 
Federal crime which carries a 
penalty of up to a $1,000 fine or 
up to five yeihs in prison, or 
both. The Postal Service offers 
a standing reward of up to 
$5,000 for information and 
services leading to the arrest 
and conviction of any person 
responsible for the burglary of a 
post office. Any information 
about a post office burglary, or 
any crime commited against the 
Postal Service or its employees, 
should be reported to the local 
postmaster in Charge in Fort 
Worth.

The 24-hour number for the 
Postal Inspector in Charge at 
Fort Worth is 817/885-1111. 
Postal Inspectors are also locat­
ed at Dallas and Lubbock in 
Texas, and at Oklahoma City 
and Tulsa in Oklahoma.

From Page 1
“ It’ s your community, your 

post office, and your mail”  said 
Arguello. “ We need the help of 
all our citizens in helping to 
reduce crimes against the Postal 
Service in our area.”

Committee
Cont. From Page 1.

In the Junior division (15 
years and down) the entry fee is 
$2.50. Proof of age must be 

. presented to officials.
Prizes in the Junior division 

include: first place, watch, 
Lindsey Jewelry; second place, 
G.E. walkie talkie, Poynor’s; 
third place, beach ball. Perry’s. 
These prizes may be seen in 
buisnesses donating them.

If the tournament is not 
completed on the night of July 3 
due to weather or time it will be 
concluded the night of July 4 
starting at 6:30.

The Muleshoe Activity Com­
mittee has asked that you go by 
these places of business that are 
donating prizes and thank them 
for taking part in these com­
munity projects?

Senate budget plan ties 
tax increase to defense 
spending.

W ied ebu sh  &  C o m p a n y

G e t  1  
FREE!

S a v e . . .  with a great deal 
on two Sum m er service

GM QUALITY 
SERVICE PARTS

GENERAL MOTORS CORPOR

Shock Absorbers
Installed S,ru,s No1 lncuidea ^
Complete Oil Change *
(Includes: Lube, Oil & «
Oil F ilter).............................. „ Z 1  #

Good Thru June

Robert D. Green, Inc.
2400 W. American Blvd. 272-4588

• V l i t c  l / l

Loans Lowered
Federal Land Bank Associations 
across the state.

“ We are encouraged by the 
response to the new program. 
We feel it could be an indicator 
that the real estate market in 
Texas is beginning to turn 
around,”  Rogge said.

The program fixes the inter­
est ra’ e for 10 years and 
converts to the bank’ s variable 
rate at the end of the 10 years. 
Purchasers must qualify under 
the Land Bank's usual credit 
standards and use the money 
for new purchases only.

According to Rogge, rates for 
the bank’ s existing variable rate

Cont. From Page i
borrowers also were reduced on 
June 1. The new rates are 10.25 
percent on farm and ranch loans 
and 10.50 percent on rural 
residence and farm-related busi­
ness loans.

The Federal Land Bank and 
44 Federal Land Bank Associ­
ations located throughout Texas 
have $2.38 billion in loan»  
outstanding on 37,000 loans to 
approximately 100,000 Texas 
farmers and ranchers.

Those interested in more 
information should contact their 
local Federal Land Bank Associ­
ation, the bank president said.

N O T H IN G  B U T  
T H E

For your GM Vehicle!
A super 6ea\. For you and  your GM vehicle. 
On the b est. . .  genuine GM quality 
and service. But, hurry. . .  these 
special prices are available 
for a limited time only!

4



TOUCH OF HISTORY

T o T he Plodding Pioneer—A Big
Salute For Progress

By VERA E N G E L K IN G  while more and more tractors 
If we could turn back the came into use and took their

^  heels of time and listen to the 
liowl of the coyote, hear the 
wind whistling over the prairie, 
and watch the Longhorn cattle 
grazing peacefully, these would 
be realities of yesteryears, but 
instead we can only reminisce.

My family came to Bailey 
County from Iowa in 1918 
to make their home on land of 
the old YL headquarters, which 

f  he community is named after, 
and a somewhat new and 
different life was a part of the 
pioneering.

Muleshoe then consisted of a 
general mercantile store and 
post office combination, a bank, 
depot, elevator, garage. Mag­
nolia Petroleum wholesale plant, 
a school used also for church, a 
hotel, and a few people. There 

ptlso was a meager means of 
communication, a telephone sy­
stem maintained by the people 
of the community with the 
switchboard in a Muleshoe 
home.

It must be remembered that 
the progress of Muleshoe is due 
to water for irrigation which 
attracted people to agriculture, 
lor without ample water the 

^county could not have become 
the farming area which it now is 
and might still have been 
ranching.

The Coldren Land Company 
helped develop the county by its 
excursion trips into the area. 
The company maintained their 
office at the bunk house of the 
YL ranch and my mother Mrs. 
Celia Matthiesen, wife of the 

#late William S.F. (Bill) Matthie­
sen who was elected the first 
county commissioner for pre­
cinct number 1, did the cooking 
for the company’ s men after we 
came to the area.

Each year more new faces 
were seen and more sodbroken. 
Some of the people became 
discouraged and left to return 
later, and some never to return; 

•because times were hard and 
the pioneers had to keep 
fighting from the bottom rung 
toward the top for progress and 
advancement.

The first irrigation wells were 
gulled by one-cyclinder Demp­
sters and sometimes brought 
discouragement to the diesel hot 
ball and pit pump farmers. Each 
spring to start the irrigating it 

•was necessary that the farmers 
not having Dempsters go down 
the ladder into the pits and 
wrap the pulleys to keep the 
belts on until water was drawn 
to pump level. They were 
always accompanied by a few 
w aterdogs which made the work 
move a little faster. Always 
some improvement to raise the 
morale of the farmers and to

•  make the great change over to 
the present on top of the ground 
pumps was necessary.

My father shipped a Rumley 
tractor, plow and threshing 
machine down from Iowa. With 
these he did custom sod 
breaking and also threshedsmall 
grains such as sudan and a 
variety of sorghum grains.
| Some farmers headed the

•  inilo and then threshed it, 
others preferred to sell it in the 
head. Of course, there were 
always Jack, Jim and Pete, the 
mules and horses, to be fed and 
they consumed considerable as 
farming was done by them 
pulling the different implements

place until now when the most 
modern machinery is used to 
harvest.

OWN ENTERTAINMENT
The people of the community 

made their own entertainment, 
such as dancing, school and 
church socials, and the never to 
be forgotten singings; they 
never lost faith with God to 
carry them through.

The fourth of July usually was 
an area affair with such events 
as a picnic, baseball games, and 
rodeos which were enjoyed very 
much by everyone.

Then the trails turned to the 
laid-out roads and advanced as 
the need came until now the 
black toopping is in the farm 
areas. Also, as the county 
became more populated, came 
the need for bigger and better 
schools. The one and two-room 
schools were deserted or torn 
down and some became the 
community centers of today, 
until now we have the con­
solidated school system.

In 1924 Bailey County saw the 
need for a new courthouse and 
the need became a reality with 
the new construction of the 
building which is still being 
used for that purpose. My 
father was elected as commi­
ssioner for precinct number 1 in 
1920 and served the county for 
ten years.

The late R.L. Brown, local 
realtor and one time mayor of 
Muleshoe, was the “ father”  of 
cotton ginning in this area and 
cotton really began to be grown. 
Some has been grown pre­
viously but had to be hauled 
to distant gins. The first gin 
was built in 1923 and the first 
bale ginned for R.G. Fort.

All the time new businesses 
were springing up and when the 
mail was delivered.on the routes 
for the first time in 1925 it was 
a real joy. Before then all the 
people had to ride or drive 
to town for their mail and 
provisions. The first carrier on 
route one was George Dodsen 
who was replaced by Gil 
Wollard who carried the mail 
until his retirement. Through 
mud and snow they con­
tinuously brought the mail, 
though it be joy or sorrow, and 
they continue to bring it.

Then finally came a country 
doctor by the name of Dr. 
Matthews who since has passed 
on with his job well done. 
Before Dr. Matthews came 
doctors had to come from 
Farwell or Clovis. Now through 
advancement we have two 
hospitals and several doctors.

Finally through Levi Pressely, 
an attorney, Muleshoe. Bailey 
ijewspaper, "The Bailey County 
Bugle."

All the time new businesses 
were being established and 
finally a theatre, a new enter- 
taintment, first the silent pic­
tures and talkies and on and on 
until WOAG in Amarillo 
brought radio into the area 
which provided more and more 
of the happenings.

The old kerosene lamps 
started fading from use as 
lighting and more people pur­
chased Delco systems and wind 
chargers until the REA brought 
the reality of the modern day 
and back again came tele­
phones, with electric lights and

our modern day television.
All this progress came about 

by the pioneers plodding away 
until now those of who remain 
look back at the reality which 
has come true. For myself, who 
grew up along with the county 
and surrounding area. I want to 
keep looking forward to a better 
future and to the younger 
generation. How fortunate they 
arc to have all the granduer and 
splendor. They must remember 
the credit due the pioneers.

Local Men 
Attend Annual 
Convention

Muleshoe Volunteer Depart­
ment Chief Jack Dunham, along 
with Captain J.O. Parker, Cap­
tain Bill Kinard and fireman 
Charles Lorance, attended the 
111th Annual Convention and 
Conference of the State Fire­
men's and Fire Marshals' 
Association of Texas, held in 
Amarillo June 13-17.

Some 500 delegates and 900 
other Association members from 
throughout the state partici­
pated in business sessions,- 
viewed state-of-the-art firefight-- 
ing equipment on display and 
competed in races to determine 
which drivers and which pump­
er teams are the best in the 
state.

Two guest speakers helped 
set the tone of the convention, 
Dan Baker, motivational speak­
er, and Carl Holmes, former 
Oklahoma City assistant fire 
chief, now owner of a consulting 
firm, encouraged their listeners 
search for the best in them­
selves and help prepare for the 
future of fire service.

Seven workshops were held 
during the convention to help 
those firefighters who wished to 
add to their professional exper­
tise in several areas of modern 
firefighting. Five of the work­
shops applied toward partici­
pants’ certification. The SFFMA 
administrators a statewide certi­
fication program, which not only 
provides a measurment system 
for those firefighters who wish 
to keep up with the latest 
developments but also aids 
cities in k'tcping "down their 
insurance key rates.

New association officers were 
installed during the convention, 
with first vice president Ernest 
0. Reesing of Alpine becoming 
president, the position vacated 
by Tommy Bledsoe of Lone Star 
Steel Company.

Social activities also allowed 
attendees to meet with old and 
new friends and experience 
some of the host city’ s offerings 
and points of interest, including 
the outdoor musical "Texas", 
held in Palo Duro Canvon.

The State Firemen’s Associa­
tion was founded in 1876, and 
represents all Texas firefighters- 
volunteer and career-in the 
State Legislature and Congress. 
The Association was instru­
mental in passage of legislation 
setting up pension systems for 
paid and volunteer firefighters, 
and was designated by the 
Legislature as a sponsor of the 
Annual Municipal Firem en's 
Training School offered by the 
Fire Protection Training Divi­
sion of the Texas Engineering 
Extension Service.
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* * *

Visiting recently with Rev. 
and Mrs. Pitts Davis and Sarah 
were his parents Rev. and Mrs. 
Jimmy Davis of Detroit, Texas.
I hey were also here to attend 
the Eighth grade graduation 
Thursday night when their 
granddaughter, Sarah was 
among (he graduating class 
members.

* * *

Sudan and area received from 
1 U> a little over an inch of rain 
earlier this week.

* * *

Donna, Lance. Danya and 
Macic have been in Baifd 
visiting her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Carroll Gillit and other 
family members.

* * *

Visiting last week with Mrs. 
Edna Dent were her nephew, 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Kittley of
Kernes.

* * *

Dan Foley and Rodney Max- 
field received their five year 
service awards recently from 
Whcelabrator Coal Services at 
folk Plant.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Engrain 
have returned home from vaca­
tioning at different places of 
interest.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. David Rowe, 
presently of Lubbock and former 
Sudan residents, visited with 
friends here Wednesday includ­
ing Mrs. Estelle Lowe.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Al Harrison of 
Canyon were Sudan visitors 
Tuesday and attended the 
funeral services for Hoyt 
Robertson. They also visited his 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Haynie and also her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. W.C. Masten.

Henry San Miguel has been a 
patient in the Amherst hospital 
this week where he was to 
undergo some tests.

* * *

Mrs. Lisa Walser and Lauren 
Elizabeth were released from 
he Methodist hospital and have

AAU Design 

Winner Chosen
An entry by Richard Nichols 

of Clovis was chosen last week 
as the winner of the AAU pin 
and program cover design 
contest. The design will be used 
for the lapel pin and official 
program cover for the AAU/ 
USA Junior Olympics National 
Girls Championship Tournament 
to be held in Clovis, N.M. July 
3-10.

Nichols’ design featured a 
basketball backboard in colors 
of red, white and blue, with the 
official AAU logo above the net.

Nichols, a native of Enochs, is 
self employed. His wife Carol is 
a sales manager for ASCOM. 
The couple has two children: 
Chris. 7 and Dustv 3.

returned home.
* * *

Mr. and Mrs. James Anslow 
of Slidell. La. have been here 
visiting this week with her
sister. Mrs. Rhoda Minyard.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Lace- 
well have been in Austin 
recently to attend seminars for 
ihe school.

SUBSCRIBE TODAY!
Fill In-Clip out & mail with your check or money or 
bill me accordingly to

Muleshoe Publishing Co.

Box 449
Muleshoe, Texas 79347

Name
Street
Apt.
City 
County 
State 
Zip Code
Muleshoe Journal & Bailey County Journal By Mail & 
Surrounding Counties......................................... $14.75
Muleshoe Journal & Bailey County Journal By Mail
(Elsewhere).......................................................W .50
Muleshoe Journal & Bailey County Journal
By carrier............................ .......................... SI2.50

We Wont To Serve You 

This Wheat Harvest

Let Us:

Buy Your Wheat

Store Your Wheat

Issue Warehouse Receipts For 
Government Loan

Custom Clean & Bag Your Wheat 
For Seed

Buy Your Generic Certificates 

( Check Daily For Quotes )

i / i k

TELEPHONE
806/272-4541

GR AIN C O M P A N Y, INC.
M A X  KING

1201M FIRST 
MULESHOE, TX 79347

♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦
Here They A re . The 3 
Top “Father’s O f The Year

66
99 Congratulations

f r o m : l 8t

\  <sV

Prize Winner is Anthony Gauna, Rt. 1, Box 202A, Fort Sumner, N.M. 88119

I T h in k  My Dad Is Tops Because..

He /s there a
l  need He’s lavase. 
a p e r fe c t  fathehk<? mme 
is whpT i  which e v e r /  
China in this word wve 
one. he is tt/e/ma ana 
He is a good example
d'or me. r Thimc He is 
The best, i  love urn 
whdf  more can r say

N o. 1 LeUer C arlos

2nd Prize W inner 
is

Jill Chandler 
Rt. 1, Box 38J 
Portales, N.M. 88130

3rd

* X r

Prize W inner 
is

Misty McCain 
HC 2 Box 6A 

Littlefield, Tex. 79339

A & M  w o u ld  lik e  to  T h a n k  e v e ry o n e  w ho  p a r t ic ip a te d  in 
o u r c o n tes t and  fo r  a ll  th e  n ic e  le tte rs .

3rd Prize 
A:

(W inners  w ill be contacted 
by phone and by letter.)

r
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WINS FIRST PLACE-"-The Birdwell Cattle Company softball team won first place in the Olton 
Volunteer Ambulance Association tournament held recently.

Cheerleaders Will Attend 
Wayland Camp

Space is filling quickly for 
Wayland Baptist University’s 
eighth annual Cheerleader 
Camp, slated for Aug. 10-13.

Jointly sponsored by Wayland 
and the National Cheerleader 
Association, the four-day camp 
is shaping up to be the largest 
yet, according to Camp Director 
Joe Provence.

“ W e’ve already more than 
doubled last year’s enrollment 
at this time,”  Provence said. 
“ Dormitories are beginning to 
fill up, and space will be at a 
premium before long."

The local camp is open to all 
w w w w m w w w " W

interested cheerleader squads 
and will feature instruction on 
the beginner, intermediate and 
advanced levels.

NCA staff members will 
provide training in everything 
from fund raising to planning a 
pep rally, and instruction will be 
conducted on both an individual 
and group basis.

The camp will also include a 
sponsor workshop program, 
through which cheerleader 
sponsors may participate and 
learn. Areas to be covered 
include the role and responsi­
bilities of the sponsor, tryouts, 
and leadership.

” We strongly urge sponsors 
to attend the camp with their 
w w w *  'm w v w w

Truck TractorPassenger

Alex's Tire Service
For Service 24 Hours A Day

Telephone 272-5012

Alex Aguirre 30 2  e. American Blvd.
^ 4

If You Need An 
Ambulance Call
272-4200

Bag A  Deere
Bag a Deere now and we’ll give you 

90 days to pay... interest free
Buy any John Deere Ginsumer Product with your 
John Deere Credit Card, and we’ll give you 90 days 

to pay, interest free! Hurry, though. Offer expires
June 30,1987.

Low monthly payments 
with a John Deere credit card

Lawn Mqwers
as 1< >\\ as

$ 2 5 .0 0
per month \v:th JD C C

Riders
as It )\v as

$ 4 8 .0 0
per month with JD C C

Lawn Dractors
as It >\v as

$ 79.00
per month with JD CC

Lawn and Garden Tractors
as low as

$ 1 4 0 .0 0
per month with JD C C

W. Hwv. 84
Dent & Co,

Muleshoe

1 JOHN D € t «  ,

272-42%

Congressman Proposes Public 
AIDS Protection

squads," said Provence. "This 
is an excellent opportunity for 
them to gain expertise in all 
areas pertaining to their own 
situations."

All participants will be 
housed in air-conditioned dorm­
itories on the Wayland campus 
and fed in the University 
Center. Extracurricular events 
include a swimming party and 
talent show.

Cost of the camp is $105 per 
resident cheerleader and $68 for 
sponsors. Commuter cheer- 
.leaders may pay a reduced rate 
of $68 each.

A deposit of $50 is required 
to reserve space in the camp, 
which is filled on the first-come, 
first-served basis. Interested 
•cheerleaders and sponsors 
should contact Provence at (806) 
296-5521 as soon as possible.

A flatterer is a friend who is yOtJr̂  
inferior, or pretends to be so.

-Aristotle.

Addressing the growing con­
cern over the threat of Acquired 
Immune Deficiency Syndrome 
(AIDS), Congressman Larry 
Combest (R-Texas) has cospon­
sored legislation to require 
mandatory AIDS testing of 
specific groups to determine the 
extent of this national public 
health epidemic.

The legislation, H.R. 2283, 
would require testing of federal 
prisoners and immigrants and 
would require States to institute 
testing of specific groups in 
order to receive federal funds to 
combat venereal disease. Those 
individuals to be tested include 
persons seeking a marriage 
license, persons convicted of 
prostitution, persons convicted 
of IV drug use, persons between 
the ages of 15 and 49 who are 
admitted to hospitals and 
persons being treated for 
venereal disease.

It is imperative that we have 
sufficient data to determine the 
magnitude of the AIDS infection 
in order to combat this fatal 
d isea se ,"  said Congressman 
Combest. "T h e  Center for 
Disease Control estimates that 
the AIDS virus will eventually 
infect 5 percent of all 
Americans."

“ In most cases, the groups 
selected for testing represent 
persons who have some contact 
with health officials and cases in 
which it would be efficient and 
economical to perform a test for 
the presence of the AIDS 
antibody. In other instances, the 
groups represent high-risk pop­
ulations which should be tested 
to protect those who may 
unknowingly interact with AIDS 
carriers,”  the Lubbock Con­
gressman said.

"Testing of federal prisoners 
is necessary because of dangers 
of inmate exposure to the AIDS 
virus. Currently, only the 
District of Columbia and three 
other states test inmates on a 
routine basis. Recent testing at 
a District of Columbia jail 
revealed that 80 of those 
inmates who had used IV drugs 
were infected with the AIDS 
virus,”  said Combest.

Combest said that the U.S. 
should not accept immigrants 
with a fatal communicable 
venereal disease. The Immigra­
tion and Naturalization Service 
(INS) is currently considering 
^enactment of this policy.

"Since many applicants for 
marriage licenses are currently 
required to undergo blood 
testing, it will be relatively

economical and efficient to test 
of AIDS. Furthermore, with the 
large number of couples seeking 
marriage, this test would serve 
as a good random survey of the 
magnitude o f the d isea se ,"  
Combest noted.

"Persons convicted of prosti­
tution, IV drug use and indi­
viduals currently being treated 
for venereal disease represent 
high-risk groups and should be 
tested for the AIDS virus," said 
Combest,

The final groups of persons to 
be tested under the legisla­
tion is hospital admittees 
between the ages of 15 and 49. 
"Routine testing of this group 
could result in the testing of 
about 38 million people each 
year. The age group is limited 
to those who are more likely to 
be sexually active and possible 
IV drug users," Combest said.

The legislation has been 
endorsed by: Eagle Forum, 
Leadership Action, Concerned 
Women for America, Child and 
Family Policy Division. Associ­
ation of Christian Schools Inter­
national, Committee to Protect 
the Family, American Research 
Institute, United Families of 
America, Public Advocate/ 
Young Americans For Freedom, 
Moral Majority, National Pro- 
Family Coalition, Coalition for 
America, Society for the defense 
of Tradition - Family - Prop­
erty, Sound Policy and Save Our 
Schools.

Three- Way News
m/

By: Mrs. H.W. Garvin

If wc did not flatter ourselves, the 
flattery of others would not hurt us.

• -La Rochefoucauld.

M l-  a n d  M r s  W P  ,W iw .< v .  
from Oklahoma City spent the 
past week with his parents the
Andrew Wittners.

* * *

Mrs. S.G. Long and Mrs. 
Beulah Toombs visited Mrs. 
H.W. Garvin Wednesday even-P

, i n g ’

Friday afternoon little Sarah 
Furgeson, baby daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny Furgeson was 
honored with a baby shower at
the Three Way home ec room.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Shuck 
and Mrs. Shucks mother from 
Arizona spent Saturday n ig h t ' 
with their aunt, Mrs. Minnie 
Dupler.

* * *

The Three Way Baptist 
Church had a guest speaker Mr. 
Burley Anderson. A Gidean 
speaker from Levelland Sunday 
morning.

* * *

Eugena Dupler from Level- 
land spent the week end with I 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Dupler.

* * *

The Kindle families all spent 
the week end at Hubberd Lake 
at a family reunion.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Wit- 
tner attended the funeral of a 
relative in Waco over the
weekend. I

* * *

The Jack Lane family visited 
her mother, Nettie Quesen- 
bery, in Muleshoe Saturday.

* * *

Mr. and Mrs. S.G. Long 
spent a long week end in
Canyon and Amarillo visiting.

* * *

OJte '^family © j cDouis QMsbeg rXo 
&p/t62S cJfeiA ufyp/ieciata (xJoti ^Visits, 
Ca/tofs, 9®owe/is & ^ayg/tg Qftat QjUe/te ed 
3m ©u/t rjfime © j 2 omow.

J m y  & cfoye ^Beagfley 
y, Jfet/tLa, tXa/ta & ^Mikamda ‘rJ/tce 

" ' ,  * ‘ ' -JMom ^eogfley

p >
Attention

(]J J P  Participants
W e have an inexpensive

Sorghum-Sudangrass Cover Crop 
for your accepted CRP acres.

1. Three-Way Cross

2. Heavy Foliage

3. Drought Tolerant

4. Fast Growth

5. Noxious Weed Free

DINE-A-MITE
H ybrid  Sorghum -Sudangrass

Wiedehush & Company
PHONE 272-4611 1620 WEST AMERICAN MULESHOE, TEXAS

O

<>

o

n
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Bailey County
Journal Classified Call 2 7 2 -4 5 3 6

CLASSIFIED
KATES

Per Word..... S. 15
Minimum Charge 

$2.30

Consecutive 
Insertions 

Minimum Charge 
$2.00

CLASSIFIED 
DISPLAY RATES 

$1.75
Per Column Inch

deadlines
12 noon I ues.

For Thursday Paper 
12 noon Friday 

For Sunday Paper 
We reserve the 
right to classify, 
revise, or reject any 
ml. Not responsible 
fur any error after 
ml has ran once.

1. Personals

f  CUSTOM ROUND hay 
baling call after 7:00 
Larry Free 925-6739. 
fl -18s-tfc

MARY KAY COSME­
TICS Josie Flowers 
272-3865. 
fl-49s-tfc *

\f ASTER CARD / VI- 
wSA' Regardless of cre­

dit history. Also, new 
credit card. No one 
refused/ For info. 
Call 1-315-733-6062. 
EXT. MI741. 
l-23s-5tspts

A NEW U
iTan ahead for sum­

mer. tighten & tone. 
Lose inches that 
stay off, with A 
NEW U Body Wrap. 
Call for appointment 
Farwell, 481-3848.
1 - 14s-13tsc

STORAGE 
Rooms Available 

For Storage 
$25.00-$30.00 

per month 
Ted Barnhill 

272-4903 
bl-42s-tfc

CONCERNED 
About Someone’s 

Drinking?
HELP IS 

AVAILABLE 
through AI-Anon 

Call 227-2350 or 
%5-2870 or come to 
visit Tuesday
’’ ights. 8:00 p.ni. or 
Saturday mornings 
aI 10:30 a.m. at 
1116 W. American 
Blvd., Muleshoe.

5. Apts. For 
Rent

EUR NISH ED GAR-
\3e apt- tor re»t-
Water paid- Sec after 
5:00. 202 W. 8th. 
c5-24t-tfc
ARTS, for rent nice 1 
«  2 bdrm., furnished 
and unfurnished 272- 
7575. 
p5-25t-tfc

8. Real Estate

DESPERATE'" 
MAKE OFFER. WILL 
IRADE EQUITY FOR 
ANYTHING OF 
VALUE. HOME FOR 
SALE. 3 bedrooms or 
2 bedrooms and 2 
living area. \V4 baths, 
double garage, fire­
place. yard sprinkler 
stytem. quiet neigh­
borhood. 510 E. Chic­
ago. If interested call 
Marilyn at 965-2123. 
After 5:00 PM call 
272-5690 or 505/392- 
1173.
B8-24t-6tc

HOUSE FOR SALE by 
owner. 2 bdrm., 1 
bath, fireplace, and 
efficiency apartment 
in back. Owner 
financing. Call 272- 
3006‘ or 272-5813. 
g8-18s-tfc

ABANDONED
HOME

Take up payments. 
806-763-4051. Call 
Collect. 
a8-22s-tfc
FOR SALE 3 bdrm., 
I V* bath, carport, 
large utility, new 
patio cover must see 
to appreciate. Call 
272-5038. 
w8-21s-tfc

MOBILE HOMES'
N ew -U sed
I n s t a n t

F in a n c in g
Low P r i c e s

T r a d e s
W elcom e
GRAHAM

HOME CENTER
P la i n v i e w  

1 2 00  1 -2 7  S
29 3  -  8355

8-17t-tfc

James F. Hayes 
& Co.

Agricultural 
Real Estate 

Sales & Appraisals 
Vic Coker - Agent 

806-9.65-2468

2. Lost & Found

ILOST ORANGE & 
white Brittney Spaniel 
hunting dog weighes 
approximately 30 lbs., 
approximately 18 in­
ches tall. Last seen 
May 3, 8 miles South­
west of Muleshoe on, 
Rabbit Road No. 2. 
$100 Reward offered. 
Call Matt Phelps 925- 

*6485 after 8 p.m. or 
co-owner Nick Bamert 
272-4787 day. 272- 
5664 night. 
p2-20s-12tc

3. Help Wanted

*RN OR LVN Full time 
day or evening hours. 
Good starting pay, 
insurance available. 
Golden Plains Care 
Center Hereford, Tx 
364-3815. 
g3-25t-2tc

fHELR WANTED ex­
perienced bartender. 
Apply in person. 
Muleshoe Country 
Club.
m3-25s-4tc

11. For Sale 
Or Trade

FOR SALE: Black rat­
tan chairs with white 
ultra suede cushions, 
272-3747.
FOR SALE large 
round bales milo & 
haygra/.er. 272-4351, 
call after 8:00 p.m. 
hi 1-16s-tfc
19 FT. INBOARD. 
outboard large family 
boat, new upholstery, 
new 350 engine, new 
radial tires, cassette 
stereo w/booster, in 
excellent condition. 
1979 model, not used 
much. 806-647-4521 or 
806-647-3609. 
cl l-25s-8tc

15. Misc.

PRICED TO SELL 
Nice 3 bdrm, home 
cllicK Geothermal
heat pump; in ground 
heated swimming 
pool, storage shed, 
storm windows and 
jungle gym set. Call 
272-5334. 
b8-10s-stfc

THINK
CLASSIFIED!

8. Real Estate 8. Real Estate 8. Real Estate 8. Real Estate

HENRY REALTY
111 W. Ave. B 

Muleshoe, Texas 
272-4581

BRICK Home North of Miilfttb'e on Hwy 
214. 3 b e d r^ -j^ ^ rr 'I l 1 e, central 
a ir /h e ;^ ^  -«*ge Hobby Shop and
apartment on premises. Fruit Trees.•**
ONE ACRE sites for home construction. 3 
miles East of Muleshoe on HWY. 3 lots 
remain. ***
JUST COMPLETED 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
large living room, kitchen and dining. 
Excellent condition, near high school. 
Priced to sell. ***
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY on Main 
Street, over 4,000 sq. ft., income 
producing property.

* * *

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY- Excellent ren­
tal income from 4 separate offices. Lease 
agreements in force.

* * *

3 Br, 2 bath, spacious home outside city 
limits, near city on highway. 29’x40’ 
metal building. Lot 85’x62\

* * *

3 Br, 1 bath, completely remodeled, edge
of city on highway.

* * *

VACANT LOT for Mobile home immediate 
possession.

* * *

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY on West Ameri- 
can Blvd. ideal location Building ready for 
occupancy.

917
per

SMALLWOOD REAL ESTATE-BROKER 
232 MAIN 272-4838
2- bedroom, one bath, stucko, small lot. 

,$200.00 Down, $200.00 per month
* * * * *

3- bedrooni. two bath mobile home. 
Hickory. $500.00 down. $200.00 
month.

*****
STUCCO, 3-bedroom, two bath, central 
heat, evaporative cooling on roof, carpet 
1360 sq. feet. $19,900.00.

*  * * * * *

RICHLAND HILLS, corner lot. 3-bedroom, 
W*' bath, • 2-car garage, central heat, 
evaporative roof cooler, range, dishwasher, 
carpet, drapes.

ABANDONED HONES. 

2 and 3 Bedrooms. 

Low Down.
We Deliver.

Call 894-8187

REPOS-DOUBLES 
&  SINGLES.

2 and 3 Bedrooms. 
Easy Credit.

Call 894-7212.

18. Legal

NOTICE
This is to give notice 
of intent to intro­
duce a Called Session 
of the 70th Legisla­
ture. a bill to be 
entitled an Act relat­
ing to creation of the 
Muleshoe Area 
Hospital District.

* cl8-25s-ltc

WHITT-REID
R E A L  E S T A T E

201 Main Office 272-3611
JUST listed 3-2-1 stucco good location for 
$28,000.00

" I f  You Want If Sold-See Us"
Roy Whitt v Thursie Reid
272-3058 272-5318
Broker, CREA, Appraiser

"We Try Harder"

O ne M inute  
S po rts  Q uiz
1. Who was the National 

, League’s Most Valuable
Player in 1985?

2. Who was the Ameri­
can League MVP that year?

3. What tow college 
baseball teams met in the 
college world series last 
year?

Answers:
1. Willie McGee, of the 

St. Louis Cardinals.
2. Don Mattingly, of the 

New York Yankees.
3. The U. of Arizona 

defeated Florida State.

T oo Late To 
Classify

HELP WANTED: 
Stcere Tank Lines Inc. 
in Dimmitt, Tx. is 
now excepting appli­
cations for experi­
enced semi - truck 
drivers. One year ex­
perience in the last 3 
years necessary. Must 
be at least 21 years of 
age. Please apply in 
person. We are an 
equal opportunity 
employer. 
s3-25t-4tc

B IB L E  " T 1 
V E R S E  z a

A soft answer turneth 
away wrath: but grievous 
words stir up anger."

1. Where is this 
quotation found in the 
bible?

2. Who is the author?
Answers to Bible Verse
1. Proverbs 15:1.
2. Solomon.

8. Real Estate 8. Real Estate • 8. Real Estate 8. Real Estate

116 E. Ave. C. BINGHAM & NIEMAN REALTY 272-5285 — 272-5286

We have homes for as little as $600.00 total move in cost, with payment scheduled according to 
income for Qualified buyers!!!!!income for qualified buyers

RICHLAND HILLS
NICE-3-2-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, built-ins,
FP. fenced yard, & more.....*****
IMMACULATE 3-2-2 Brick, corner lot. 
Cent. A&H, built-ins, FP, loads of storage 
& closet space, sprinkler sys.!!!!!

, *****
PRICE REDUCED-3-1-1 Brick. Cent, heat,
Evap. air, built-ins, fenced yard......

*****
SPACIOUS-3-.3-2 Brlf
ins, FP. I*v 
utility, f t y ^ i o .

H, built- 
ioom, basement, 

much more!!!!!
*****

HIGH SCHOOL

OWNER FINANCE-3-2 home, corner lot, 
built-ins, nice carpet, fenced yard. 
$20’ s !!!!!

*****
IMMACULATE-3-\-\ Brick. Cent. heat.
Evap. air, fenced yard. $30’ s......

*****
PRICE REDUCED-3-2-2 Brick, Cent. 
A&H, built-ins, nice carpet, FP, 
basement!! !!!$40’s.

*****
JUST LISTED-3-2-2 home, corner lot, nice 
carpet, fenced yard. $30’ s !!!!!

*****
3-2-1 Brick, Cent. energy efficient,
earthtone carpetsG kj^

K * * * *

3-1-1 home, corner lot. Cent. A&H, 
built-ins. $30’s.....

*****
SPACIOUS 3-2 Brick, Cent. A&H. built- 
ins. nice den w/FP. fenced yard, storage 
bldg., & much more. $70’s !!!!

*****
2-1-1 home, wall furnace heat, nice
carpets. $16,000.....

*****
JUST LISTED-3-1 home, nice carpets, new 
roof, storm windows, & much more. 
$20’s !!!!! *****

*****
NICE 3-2-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
fenced yard. $40’s !!!!!

*****
3-1 Vi-l home. Central Heat, Nice. Priced 
To Sell. *****
3-2-2 carport home, corner lot, nicely
remodeled. $30’s.....

*****
3-2-1 carport hony'^(?ent. heat, nice 
earthtone carpet.*i\V^f!!!T̂>****
JUST LISTED-2-\-\ home, nice carpets,
storm windows. $20’sH! !

*****
LARGE BLDG, on 2 lots, paved parking.... 

*****
PRICED TO SELL-Office Bldg. across from 
courthouse..... *****

sq. ft.APPROX. 3.000 sq. ft. bldg., 
frontage. CASH PRICE $15,000.00 *****

Railroad

LENAU ADD.
3-2-2 carport home. Cent. A&H, large den 
w/FP. end. patio, loads of 
$50’s !!!!! storage.

COUNTRY CLUB
3-2-2 Brick. Cent. A&H, built-ins, fenced 
yards, & more. $50’s!!M!

*****

COUNTRY HOMES
JUST LISTED-N'ice 3-2-2 Brick home on 
2.5 acres, built-ins, fireplace, on pavement 
close to town!!!!!

*****
3-2-3- carport home, built-ins. Geo. A&H.
storm cellar, barns, corrals, 11 acres.....

*****
3-1-2 home, Vi acre, Cent. A&H. new
paint, nice carport, cellar. $30’s !!!!!

*****
2-1 home, 20 acres, sub. pump, sprinkler.
barns & corrals. $40's!!!!!

*****
WELL IMPROVED 40 acre cattle set-up.
PRICED TO SELL.....

* * * ♦ * _

475 acres. 8 wells, t il^ V V  .. for pivots on 
paved FM road v . town. Priced to 
Sell!!!!

HIGHLAND ADD.
JUST LISTED-2-1-1 home, wall heat, evap. 
air. fenced yard. $20’ s !!!!! _

GEORGE NIEMAN. BROKER
DIANNE NIEMAN. BROKER

WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS"

£ -
ORsr
o
n
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Father’s Day
In 1910 Mrs. John Bruce Dcxld of 

Spokane, Wash., was |he drivinjg 
force in persuading America to cele­
brate Father’s Day. The third Sunday 
in June is now observed nationally.

Each year on this day emphasis rs 
placed on a closer father-child rela­
tionship.

In today’s permissive society, 
children ire often allowed to do 
“ their own thing.” The encourage­
ment of this and protest against pa­
rental authority is strong in tire media 
and on TV.

Overlooked is the traditional 
value of fatherly discipline in the

home. Today’s problems in society 
(including drugs and crime) indicate 
more authority is desirable, often t 
necessary.

This is vitally important to the 
proper development of children— 
the sympathetic guidance “ Dad.” In 
this connection, it’s good to remem­
ber Frank Chalcy’s words:

“Character is largely caught, and 
the father and the home should be die 
great sources of character infection.”

For all those fathers trying their 
best, the 21st is their Sunday this 
year.

For Better 
Teachers

For the first time, a national board 
will issue certificates to teachers 
who exhibit competence. The 
board’s creation was announced re­
cently in San Diego.

It’s the result of months of nego­
tiations between educators and union 
spokesmen representing millions of 
teachers. It’s a by-product of the 
Carnegie Corporation study de­
signed to show the way for improve­
ment of U.S. education.

The current system of local 
boards and states licensing teachers 
is uneven, to say the least In some 
instances standards are surprisingly 
low. In many cases licensing tests are 
not an adequate measure of compe- 
lence, and fail to identify outstanding 
teachers.

The new board, a majority of 
whose 55 members are teachers, will 
offera uniform standard of testing for 
entry into the teaching profession. 
This will mean more respect for 
members of the profession and make 
teaching more like other professions.

GRAIN PRICES
CORN......345 cwt
MILO...... 315 cwt

SOYBEANS...... July -45
WHEAT.......225 new crop

COMMODITY CERTIFICATES 
104%

Prices 6-19-87 
FARMERS CO-OP 

272-4335
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