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First Annual Cancer Prayer cross Plains Volunteer

EDITOR'S NOTE: The
following information entitled 
"Build a Better Brain" is some­
thing we can all use. John 
Lowitzer sent this our way. My 
daughter Leah was just telling us 
last weekend how many brain 
cells you lose after the age of 20 
years. It was 50,000 every so 
many years. All I could think was 
it has been a long time since I was 
20, so there has to be lot of them 
lost.

We just happened to being 
playing Scategories with my 
granddaughter Tatym (age 11) at 
the time. I wasn't doing that great 
on some of the lists so I figured 
that was the problem, since I've 
been around longer than anyone 
else playing.

Leah was saying that working 
crossword puzzles and find the 
word games help you retain brain 
cells. I do neither, however 
working with words here at the 
Review does prove challenging. 
I'm hoping this will count! 111

I noticed this article titled 
"Build a Better Brain" on my 
desk and that intrigued me. 
Unfortunately, I could relate to 
the very first line, I think you will 
learn something interesting. Give 
the suggestions a try—what can 
you lose, but BRAIN CELLS. 
Vanda Anderson

"Build a Better Brain"
Do you ever misplace your 

glasses or house keys? Or walk 
into a room and forget why you 
went there?

As we age, memory lapses can 
make us fear we're losing our 
mental edge. But the good news 
is that you can not only stave off 
mental decline, you can even 
build a stronger brain.

Doctors used to think that brain 
development occurred only dur­
ing youth. But new research 
shows that humans can add new 
neurons throughout life.

Each neuron has branches 
called dendrites, and whenever 
the brain is stimulated by a new 
experience, new dendrites form. 
This is true no matter what your 
age.

Here are five ways to help 
stimulate dendrite growth and 
energize your brain:

1. Switch hands. Most us rely 
on a dominant hand for daily 
activities. Research shows that 
practicing doing things with 
your nondominant hand can 
dramatically increase the 
number of circuits in the cerebral 
cortex. Try using you 
nondominant hand to brush your 
teeth, cut your food, or style your 
hair. Even better, try writing with 
your nondominant hand. Doing 
this helps you develop speech 
abilities in the nondominant side 
of your brain. This facilitates 
quicker recovery in the event of a 
stroke.

2. "Lose" a sense. New neural 
pathways form when you 
exercise your senses in ways you 
normally don't. It's well-known.

See Down Home Page 10

Junior High 
vs. Santo

October 19, 2006 
5:00 p.m. T here

Walk is a Huge Success
By

Rebecca Evans 
Photo Journalist Major 

University of North Texas

A sudden rainstorm outside 
could not dampen the hope and 
support found inside the old 
gymnasium at Cross Plains High 
School last Saturday night.

Despite being relocated an hour 
before the event started, the 
Cross Plains Cancer Prayer Walk 
attracted a number of people and 
families from all walks of life, in 
support of those who are battling 
or have beaten cancer.

At the center of the walk was 
Kathy Purvis, a 3rd-6th grade 
science teacher and survivor of 
breast cancer.

"I've never seen the community 
pull together like they did," Pur­
vis said of the outreach she saw 
after the fire. "I think that's what 
we neglect when someone has 
cancer."

Purvis wanted to remind the 
community of how much comfort 
and support cancer patients need. 
She stressed that her biggest 
source of support during her 
cancer battle came from her 
church family.

"The support meant so much to 
me," Purvis said. "That's what the. 
Lord wants us to do; comfort and 
support each other. And that's 
what I feel like my ministry is."

Money raised will help Cross 
Plains' cancer victims travel to 
and from doctor appointments

Fire Department Fish 
Fry is this Friday Night

The Cross Plains Volunteer Fire 
Department will be having a Fish 
Fry on Friday, October 20, at the 
Cross Plains Community Center.

Serving will begin at 5:00 p.m. 
and continue through 8:00 p.m. 
The cost for the meal will be 
$8.00 for adults and $3.00 for 
children 12 and under.

You will have a choice of FISH 
or CHICKEN, cole slaw, French 
fries, hush puppies, red beans, 
desserts and tea.

The CPVFD is doing this to

replenish the funds that were 
depleted during the wildfires and 
to replace old worn out equip­
ment, so that they can better 
serve the community when in 
need.

We look forward to seeing and 
visiting with you at the Fish Fry.

Gift certificates are available! 
Call Dee Harrell at 254-725- 
7120.

Submitted by 
Scarlett Koettel 

CPVFD Reporter

General Election early 
voting begins October 23rd

and cancer treatments. Recipi­
ents will be asked to fill out a 
questionnaire, and will be chosen 
based on need by a committee 
composed of members of 
churches from Cross Plains.

Several groups came to show 
their support for the cancer 
walk by selling food to raise

money, passing out promotional 
information, or simply putting a 
smile on the faces of the 
patients, caregivers, supporters 
and children. Groups include 
First Baptist Church groups, Bro. 
Ronnie White; Church of Christ 
group, Bro. Bob Pipes, James 

See Cancer Walk Page 6

Early voting for the November 
7th General Election will begin 
at three locations in Callahan 
County on October 23rd, ac­
cording to Callahan County elec­
tion officials.

Early voting will take place each 
weekday at the County Court­
house Room #102 in Baird, at 
the Justice of the Peace office in 
Clyde and the Justice of the 
Peace office in Cross Plains.

Early voting will begin on Mon­
day, October 23rd and will end 
on Friday, November 3rd. Early 
voting hours are between 8:00 
a.m. and 5:00 p.m. each week­

day.
Applications for ballots by mail 

must be received no later than 
the close of business on Tues­
day, October 31st. Applications 
for ballots by mail should be 
mailed to: Jeanie Bohannon, 
100 West 4th, Suite 104, Baird, 
Texas 79504.

The only contested race in 
Callahan County involves the 
race for Cross Plains Precinct #4 
Commissioner race between 
Republican Party candidate Cliff 
Kirkham and Democratic Party 
candidate Elvan Goode.

Registration for LAP 
and LAP-SIT Underway

Inevitable Changes in 
the Works for City

By Deborah Lowitzer 
Special Writer

Rate Increases on the Horizon 
for City Commercial Waste 
Water Rates * Questions of 
Possible Property Taxes * 
Urgent Need for a Back-Up 
Officer and Moving The Senior 
Citizen Center highlight the 
October 10th Council Meeting 

♦Discussion flowed about 
increasing Commercial Waste 
Water Rates. Debbie Gosnell, 
City Secretary, stated that the 
current rates were 'way out of line' 
compared to surrounding cities 
such as Baird, Rising Star and 
Cisco. She read proposed rate 
hikes for each of the business 
establishments in town, as well as

the school. She then added, 
"Before we make any increases, 
we have to meet with people and 
explain why."

The increase in waste water 
rates will be on the agenda for the 
next meeting on November 14th. 
Citizens in the business commu­
nity who want to have a say 
regarding these decisions are 
encouraged to attend this next 
meeting.

♦Mayor Ray Purvis asked again 
about the possibility of imple­
menting a curfew. He suggested 
that they pass an ordinance so 
Don Gosnell can send violators 
home. Some thought that in order 
to enforce it, the City needs a 2nd 
officer. Purvis moved to put the 
curfew issue on next month's

agenda as well. Discussion 
turned again to the urgent need 
for a 2nd officer to help Don 
Gosnell out since he has no back 
up and obviously can not be in 
two places at once.

♦Lichty suggested that the City 
advertise in some 'trade' maga­
zines, since they haven't tried that 
before. Debbie said that they 
needed to make up their minds on 
how to pay for one before they 
advertise. Lichty countered that 
the police budget is there, and the 
City needs to not let it trickle 
down into other projects, but keep 
it strictly for police matters. 
He advised, "Don't co-mingle the 
funds. Have a police department 
budget."

See Council Minutes Page o

Registration is now underway 
for the LAP and LAPSIT 
programs at the Cross Plains 
Public Library.

The "Learn About..." Program 
is the preschool program for 
children ages 3-5 who are not 
currently enrolled in the pre­
school program at the local 
school. Your child must be 3 
years old by September 1,2006 to 
attend. The program gives 
children the opportunity to sing, 
learn finger-plays, hear stories, 
do activity, have refreshments, 
and check out books from the 
library.

The LAPSIT .program is for 
parents and their children from 
birth to age three. This program 
also offers age appropriate sto­
ries, finger-plays, songs and 
games to be repeated at home.

The programs will be held 
Wednesday mornings 10:00- 
10:45 a.m., starting November 1 
and continue until the end of 
April.

The operating hours for the 
library are 1:00-5:00 p.m.,
Monday through Friday.

Submitted by 
Beverly Ross

H A R V E S T  
HAPPENING  
Scheduled for 
October 21

Harvest Happening is set for
Saturday, October 21, from 6:00 
to 8:(X) p.m. at the First Baptist 
Church Family Life Center.

All children MUST be 
accompanied by an adult. 
Admission is one (1) can good per 
person. Family friendly costumes 
only!

Let’s all join together for a fun 
time of fellowship, games, prizes 
and candy.

Treat bags will be provided.

C ross P la in s C om m u n ity  
Wide Yard Sale this Weekend

Come to the High School 
Pavilion early (8:00 a.m.) 
Saturday morning for your 
chance to find a bargain, special 
household item, or a "new” old 
piece of furniture, a good article 
of clothing, whatever you need, 
the Beta Sigma Phi (BSP) women 
will probably have it. Items will 
include an oak entertainment 
center, two wingback chairs (not 
matching), wood filing cabinets, 
and much more.

Then get your Participant’s List 
for all the other Yard/Garage 
Sales in town, as well as a list of 
all retail participants who will 
have sales or discounts. The

current list of merchants include: 
The Hummingbird Coffeehouse, 

H igginbotham s’, The Movie 
Store and Tanning Salon, Dub 
Meador’s Flea Market (Cockatiel 
& Quaker birds sale). Taste of 
Texas, the Subway, the Staghorn 
Cafe, Lawrence Farm & Ranch 
Supply, Sun Rayz Tanning Salon, 
and Johnson’s Dry Goods.

Attention gardeners and 
hom eowners/renters! Go by 
Lawrence’s for a special sale on 
landscaping edging rounds, 
which regularly sell for $1.90 
each, for 25 or more, .80 cents 
each. Stepping stones (square), 
regularly sell for $1.25, for 25 or

more, .90 cents each. They will 
have other items (terra cotta 
rounds) and shelving, wall 
baskets, peg boards, file cabinets, 
many more items on sale.

The old Western Auto Store has 
new owners and will be selling 
some of the inventory.

The Movie Store is giving 10% 
off all tanning products.

These are just a few items that 
will be listed on the Participants 
List, with map and directions.

BSP is sponsoring the 
community wide sale and 
proceeds from the high school 
pavilion sale and merchants’ 
donations will be used for

community service projects 
and scholarships. Due to the 
overwhelming success of 
participation last year, BSP was 
able to increase their donations 
to area volunteer fire departments, 
the Cross Plains Library, and 
EMS.

If you have not registered and 
still want to be a part, to have your 
name and specials advertised on 
the Participants List, contact 
Sharon Parr no later than 
Thursday, October 19, at 
254-725-6879.

Submitted by 
Carol Bennett
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First Baptist Church 
Plans Women’s Retreat

Courthouse News
Sharon Lee

Sharon Lee Stephenson, age 61, 
passed away Tuesday, October 
10, 2006 at Hendrick Health 
System in Abilene.

Funeral services were held at 
10:00 a.m. Friday, October 13, 
2006 at the Higginbotham Chapel 
in Cross Plains with Darrell 
Hohmann officiating. She will be 
cremated following the service.

Sharon was bom in Sioux City, 
Iowa on August 11, 1945 to 
Thomas and Alta M. (Abbott) 
Hood. She married Charles 
Stephenson in Yankton, South 
Dakota on December 23, 1972. 
She was a homemaker and a 

l l l l l l l lHll ll ll^Hll l

Stephenson
member of the Church of Christ 
Latter Day Saints.

Survivors include her husband, 
Charles Stephenson of Cross 
Plains; sons, Edward L. 
Stephenson and Dana Lee 
Stephenson, both of Cross Plains, 
Dana Lyman Stephenson of Ft. 
Bliss, Texas and Thomas Charles 
Stephenson of Ft. Bragg, North 
Carolina; two daughters, Ann 
Marie Trugan of Las Vegas, 
Neveda and Mary L. Stephenson 
of Cross Plains; and 16 
grandchildren.

She was preceded in death by 
her parents and an aunt. 
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CORNERSTONE BIBLE CHaRCH
832 Ave. E Cross Plains, TX

Pastor* Sunday Morning Bible Study... 10:00 AM
U7 II- o *  Morning Worship......................11:00 AM
W a lte r  P o p e  Evening Worship......................6:00 PM

Wednesday Night Bible Study...7:00 PM

Our Church Is A House Of Prayer

CROSS PLAINS CO W BO Y CHURCH
Pastor: LEN SMITH

Join Us On
Sunday Mornings At 10:30 a.m.
16075 CR 459 Cross Plains, Texas 

For Information
Call 254-725-6446 or 325-518-5514

COME AS YOU ARE!

All women of the community 
are invited to a first-ever in-house 
women's retreat scheduled at 
the First Baptist Church on 
November 3-4.

Linda Schendanze from 
Weatherford will be speaking on 
our "Identity in Christ".

Friday evening activities will 
begin at 6:00 p.m. with a light 
supper, games, a drama, music 
and Bible study with breakout 
sessions. The evening will close 
at 9:30 p.m. for fellowship, 
sharing, lots of laughter as we 
playing games of your choice and 
have an evening of fun and a girl's 
night out.

Saturday morning activities 
will start with breakfast from 8-9 
a.m, followed by Bible study, 
music and breakout sessions. 
Lunch will be provided and the 
session will be concluded with a 
Chinese Gift Swap. Be sure to 
bring a wrapped "white elephant" 
gift for the exchange. Closing 
will be at approximately 2:00

p.m.
Cost of the retreat is $25.00. 

Supplies needed are: sleeping 
bag, toiletries, snacks, 
board games, a wrapped white 
elephant gift, and a open heart to 
hear what Jesus has to say to you, 
and a fun spirit.

If you choose not to spend 
the night, please come to both 
sessions on Friday night and Sat­
urday. If your schedule will not 
permit you to attend on of the 
sessions, please come to the one 
you can attend. Cost for the 
Friday night session alone is $10 
and the Saturday session alone is 
$15.00.

Child care will be provided. If 
you choose to take advantage of 
this service, please bring a sack 
lunch for each of your children.

Sign-up sheets are in the First 
Baptist Church parlor, or you can 
register by calling the church of­
fice at 254-725-7629. Please sign 
up before October 29th.

Submitted by 
Linda Slaymaker

New Twist to Old Tradition 
Lord's Acre to Continue 
Read for All the Details

Since 1963, the Lord’s Acre has 
been the vehicle utilized by the 
First United Methodist Church to 
share our God given talents with 
the Cross Plains area. Organized 
originally as a way of tithing 
by the agricultural community, 
farmers would donate the profits 
from one acre of their land to 
the church. This idea of giving 
gradually evolved to all church 
members donating their gifts of 
quilting, canning, baking, crafting 
and even auctioning several hours 
of personal labor to the highest 
bidder. The live auction always 
followed a delicious home cooked 
turkey dinner that was served to 
hundreds of hungry friends and 
neighbors, either at the church or 
from an off site carry-out facility. 
The community support has been 
phenomenal over the years with 
regular visitors coming from 
Baird, Cisco, Brownwood, Rising 
Star to enjoy the evening.

Then came the fires of 
December 27, 2005 and the 
church, turkey roasters, coffee 
pots, tables, chairs, colored table 
covers, silverware, etc. etc. etc. 
went up in flames. We had 
nothing left with which to 
operate the Lord’s Acre.

Then came the love and prayers 
from all corners of the world. 
Money, organs, hymnals, pillows, 
coloring books, food, communion 
sets, coffee pots, tables, chairs, 
etc. etc. etc. We still have no home 
church facility with room for a 
dinner and auction, but we still 
have a talented, caring church 
family with many God-given 
talents to share.

After much prayer and 
discussion, the Administrative 
Council made the decision not to 
cancel, but to continue the Lord’s 
Acre on a limited basis. The 
long-standing tradition will take 
a different direction this year, 
as we will do a totally GIVING 
dinner, sharing with those less 
fortunate.

On Saturday, November 11, 
the home cooked turkey, 
dressing, beans, sweet potatoes, 
cranberries, rolls and cake 
will be delivered to shut-ins, the 
nursing center in Rising Star 
and to those folks who lost 
their homes in the fire. In 
addition to the above groups, we 
will also serve members of the 
Presbyterian Church who so 
graciously “adopted” us before 
the ashes of the Methodist Church 
had even cooled.

For this year only, we will NOT 
be serving a sit-down or carry-out 
meal; nor will there be 
the traditional auction. The 
community support for this 
annual event has always been 
greatly appreciated and the 
Methodists certainly look forward 
to the camaraderie of the evening 
in our new facility next year.

All area churches will be 
contacted this week for a list of 
their shut-ins, that we might be 
able to share this meal with them. 
Families and individuals who 
lost their homes in the fire 
will be contacted also, so that 
arrangements can be made 
to serve then at their table— 
wherever that maybe.

Submitted by Arlene Stephenson

B ullrid ing M utton B usting  
and D ance N ovem ber 11th

The Cross Plains Roping Club 
will be hosting a Bullriding, Jr. 
Steer riding and Mutton Busting, 
November 11th.

The Mutton Busting starts at 
5:00 p.m. There is a $10.00 entry 
fee and cash prizes a ribbon will 
be awarded this event will be for 
ages 7 and under. The sheep will 
be provided by Mills County 
Commission Co. Goldthwaite, 
Texas. Heath Hohertz does a great 
job! Helmets and protective 
equipment are provided along 
with plenty of assistance for 1st 
time Mutton Busters! This 
event is a lot of fun for kids and 
spectators! To enter call 325-280- 
0271.

The Jr. Steer riding for ages 12 
and under will follow. The entry 
fee is $50.00. Cash and custom 
made spurs will go to the 
Champion.

We have got some good bulls 
coming for the Open Bullriding! 
Entry fee for bulls is $75.00 plus 
$1,000 added money. We are 
taking 30 bullriders so the 
jackpot will be large! Also a 
Champion Buckle will be

presented. To enter or for more 
information call 325-280-0271.

We are really excited to have 
Country Music recording artist, 
Jamie Richards play for the dance 
starting at 9:00 p.m. It will be 
$10.00 per person and a $5.00 
cooler charge. Hope to see ya’ll 
there!

We will have a concession stand 
open serving BBQ, hot dogs, 
hamburgers, etc. Also we will be 
having drawings and give aways 
throughout the event!

Thanks to our sponsors KEAN, 
Texas Heritage Bank, Blake 
Fulenwider Dodge, Rockin U 
Bucking Bulls, Johnson’s Dry 
Goods, Hawk Portable Buildings, 
Jones Real Estate, Hummingbird 
Coffeehouse, Dana’s Famous 
Brisket-n-Ribs. Anyone wanting 
to sponsor this event please 
contact Dana, 325-280-0271.

Roping Club members will 
meet at the arena at 4 p.m. 
Saturday to discuss and get 
organized for this event. I urge 
ALL members to attend. Thanks 
see ya there!

Submitted by Dana Hall

COUNTY COURTHOUSE 
Roger Corn, Presiding

Misdemeanor Filings

Sylvia Diaz, theft by check. 
Rendi Lynn Schaedel, theft by 

check.
Ronnie W alker, theft by 

check.
Ricky L. H o l lo w ay ,  

possession of marijuana.
Charlie D. Thompson, driving 

while intoxicated (DWl).
Lanequida Brewster, driving 

while license invalid (DWLI). 
Kenneth L. Walker, DWLI. 
Jonathan D. Kutei, fleeing. 
Unda M. Mulling, DWl.

Misdemeanor Minutes

Gary Lee Pelletier, motion to 
d ism iss to  p o ssessio n  of 
marijuana granted for plea to 
other case.

Deon Ollison, plea of guilty to 
attempted theft, 60 days in jail, 
$231 court costs.

Everett D. Barron, plea of 
guilty to theft by check, $50 
fine, $200 court costs, $588.96 
restitution.

Kimberly Hogue, motion to 
revoke probation granted.

B ry so n  C a n n o n ,  o r d e r  
a m e n d i n g  c o n d i t i o n s  of 
probation granted.

S u z i e  F o r t n e y ,  o r d e r  
a m e n d i n g  c o n d i t i o n s  of 
probation granted. *

Fikadu Ebba,  motion to 
dismiss to DWl granted for plea 
to other case.

Bryan Z. Lyles, motion to 
d ismiss to p o ssessio n  of 
mari juana granted in the 
interest of justice.

Sandra Jean Woods, motion 
to reinstate bond granted.

J i m m y  P i c k e t t ,  o r d e r  
a m e n d i n g  c o n d i t i o n s  of 
probation granted.

Jessie W. Robinson, order 
a m e n d i n g  c o n d i t i o n s  of 
probation granted.

Brent Rice, plea of guilty to 
theft by check, 90 days in jail, 
$281 court costs, $360.33 
restitution.

Buster Carl McRae, plea of 
gui l ty  to p o s s e s s i o n  of 
marijuana, 60 days in jail, $700 
fine, $256 court costs.

End of term order discharging 
d e f e n d a n t s  u n d e r
m i s d e m e a n o r  p r o b a t io n :  
J a m e s  G r a h a l n ;  Gary 
Lemaster; Jessica McGlassen; 
Adrian Villa.

End of term order discharging 
defendants under deferred 
adjudication: Robert Fenton 
Walton.

Brandi Hicks, order amending 
c o n d i t i o n s  of p r o b a t i o n  
granted.

Christopher Lucas, order 
a m e n d i n g  c o n d i t i o n s  of 
probation granted.

Donald A. Dortman, affidavit 
of surety to surrender principal 
granted.

Marriage Licenses

Justin C. Jackson of Baird 
and Amy L. Cannon of Clyde.

Scott C. Nelson of Abilene 
and Mary L. Walls of Clyde.

42nd DISTRICT COURT 
John Weeks, presiding

Civil Filings

Estate of Eunice H. Pointer, 
dec eased,  appl ica tion for 
probate of will and issuance of 
letters testamentary, transfer 
from county court.

Vanica Lynn Aitchison and 
Dennis Paul Aitchison, divorce.

Fidelity & Guaranty Insurance 
Company vs. Marty Ross, 
workman's compensation.

Anna Marie C hessir and 
J a m e s  E u g e n e  C h ess i r ,  
divorce.

Civil Minutes

Mary Ann Loper and Ricky 
Dean Loper, divorce granted.

Henry Silba and Alice Silba 
and 724 Peyton, Baird, TX 
79504 and Bank of New York, 
as trustee, order to dismiss 
forclosure without prejudice 
granted.

Mary Lou King and Robert 
Brandon King, divorce granted.

Jeff and Cecelia Ziehr vs. 
Willie Carrigan dba Willie 
Carrigan & Sons, Joe Devora 
dba J  & B Masonry, Farmer 
Drywall, GRSTW, Inc. dba . 
Abilene Lumber Company and 
Citizens Glass Company, Inc., 
order of dismisal with prejudice 
as to GRSTW, Inc. dba Abilene . 
Lumber Company granted.

Kristi Barron and Cory Barron, ‘ 
divorce granted.

Murrell Dee Guthrie Hines, ! 
aka Murrell D.ee Guthrie and , 
1419 Sunset Drive, Clyde, TX ; 
79510 and Citi Financial, Inc., 
home equity foreclosure order ' 
granted.

Annette Regina Reed and  ̂
Kenneth Wayne Reed, divorce 
granted.

The State of Texas vs. 1999 ' 
F o r d  M u s t a n g ,  VIN 
#1FAFP4048XF182088, final 
default judgment granted.

Lisa Lorraine Faircloth and 
Bradley Allen Faircloth, divorce 
granted.

Laci Denise S moo t  and 
Johnny Russell Smoot, divorce 
granted.

Criminal Minutes

Jam es C. Maddle, Jr., plea of 
guilty to possession  of a 
controlled substance, 5 year 
probation, $1500 fine, $254 
court costs, $140 restitution.

William E. Guest, judgment 
revoking probation granted.

Jason Lynn Kilough, motion 
to d i smiss  to e n g a g e  in 
organized criminal activity 
(burglary of a habitation) 
granted, sentenced to federal 
prison.

T tr s t  ‘B a j)tts t 
Cfiurcd

Sunday
9:45 am Bible Study 

11 am & 6 pm Worship

Wednesday
6:30 pm PrayerAVorship

Ronnie B. White, Pastor 
(254) 725-7629

3rd & Main, Cross Plains, TX 76443

PLEASE COME JOIN THE
First United 

M ethodist Church
Worshipping with the 

First United Presbyterian Church 
200 Ave D & 2nd Street

Sunday School 9:30AM 
Sunday Morning Worship 10:45AM 

Monday Prayer Group 9:00AM 
Church Office

Men’s Prayer Breakfast 6:30AM 
Thursday Jean’s Feed Barn

J im  S e n k e l, P a s to r
Church 254-725-7377 Cell 325-280-8480
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By W allace Bennett
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Cottonwood Doings
This is the week of the 

Cottonwood Turkey Dinner and 
Musical, so don’t forget. Good 
eats start Friday evening at 5:30 
p.m., music begins at 6:30 p.m. 
The cost is; adults $6.00 and 
children $3.00. If you are shut-in 
or can’t otherwise get there, I will 
deliver a meal to your home. 
Sorry about the music though, so, 
you will have to do without. I 
can’t even whistle “Dixie” any 
more. But I am serious, call me 
at 254-725-7474.

Roundup Of Some 
Champions

Had two nice notes this week, 
both favoring the Champion 
family of Cottonwood. One was 
from Margaret Woody-Stanger of 
El Cajon, Ca., who sent some 
pictures for the Cottonwood 
Recipe Book (see photo, this 
page) and one was from Viola 
Champion Summers Tumbough, 

She sent along a clipping of the 
Cottonwood News her mother, 
Alice Champion, wrote which 
was published in the Cross Plains

Review on April 1, 1981.
People sure did visit one 

another in those days, and 
traveled a long distance to get it 
done. Just listen to the ones who 
visited in Alice’s home in just one 
week.

“Visiting Alice Champion last 
week were Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 
Nordyke of Bellaire, Texas. They 
had been visiting in Colorado. 
Friday, his sister, Mrs. Irene Wall, 
of Shreveport, La., met them here 
and visited their kinfolk. Other 
visitors to the home of Alice 
Champion were Bessie 
McMillan, Jewel Woody, yera 
Harris, Mrs. Pillans, Bernice 
Breeding, Mrs. Thelma Peevy, 
Mr. and Mrs. J.A. Woody of 
Coleman, Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Brown of Abilene, Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Wilcoxen of Amherst, 
Mr. and Mrs. Chuck Woody, 
Mrs. Ethel Clark, Mrs. Vickie 
Summers of Denver City and 
Denna Champion and a friend 
came to Buffalo Gap with a 
Church of Christ Group of 
Lubbock, and they drove down

for a visit with Denna’s grandma, 
Alice.”

Wow! What great times people 
had in the old days visiting their 
folks all over the country. 
Reminds me of the visits we used 
to make from Baird to my 
grandma and grandpa, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.H. Coats in Turkey Creek 
in the 1930’s. But that was in days 
when gasoline was 12 cents a 
gallon. But thanks for the 
memory, Viola Champion 
Summers Tumbough.

REGRETS: I have an apology 
to make to Mr. Nickolas Dimitri, 
and I do. In an earlier column, I 
stated that he had graduated from 
ACU. That was a gross error. I 
can’t at all remember why I would 
forget that he graduated from, 
Texas A&M. Sorry Nickolas.

(To provide informational items 
and items o f fact for this column, 
call Wallace Bennett at 254-725- 
7474, E-mail csb5©airmail.net. 
Snail mail is 11093 CR 440, 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443. 
Please remember, i f  I  don’t know 
it, 1 can't print it.)
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R ising S tar N ursing Center News
By Linda Merritt

m KIE H

We are very proud to announce 
the outcome from the Pecan 
Pie Bake-off Contest that the 
Chamber of Commerce had. 
Jimmielee Payne (He) took first 
place with a $50.00 prize, in 
which he graciously donated to 
the resident Christmas Fund. 
Linda Canales representing Star 
Pride awarded Mr. Payne his 
prize. Irene Starkey, Volley Joe 
Williams, and Grace Jenkins 
received ribbons for outstanding 
and excellent for their pies. Good 
job everybody.

Employees will be having a 
chili cook-off on the 25th. Those 
interested in making a pot of their 
homemade chili may do so. 
Please have your chili at the 
Center by 10:30 a.m. on the 25th 
to be judged. Come eat chili at 
1:00. Winners will be announced 
then. Prizes will also be awarded 
at this time.

We had our annual State Survey 
last week, and we are proud to 
say that we got a good report. 
Appreciation to all staff members

on jobs well done.
Attention Parents: We will be 

having our haunted house again 
here at the Center, and bags of 
candy will be given out. So bring 
the kids by at 5:30 on the 31st.

BREA KIH RU
By Bob Pipes

Cross Plains Church of Christ 
433 N. Main 

(254) 725-6117

In a magazine at M.D. Anderson Hospital in Houston, I read: 
“Some words just shouldn’t go together—words like ‘children’ 
and ‘cancer’.” Actually, though, the words “people” and 
“cancer” should not “go together”—but they often do...

October has been “Cancer Awareness Month,” with a lot of 
emphasis placed upon it in the newspapers, radio, TV, etc. We 
even had our own “Cancer Walk” here in Cross Plains this past 
Saturday aftemoon/evening. It was such a blessing to everyone, 
especially those of us who have family members with cancer or 
who have lost the battle to cancer—and those with cancer, and 
survivors of the dread disease. Kathy Purvis was the one who 
got the “Cancer Walk” begun, and along with a lot of others who 
joined in to help her plan, promote and execute it, “THANK 
YOU!”
' But you know, sin is kind of like cancer. If not treated, it spreads 
like wildfire! Jesus provided the treatment, yea the cure, through 
forgiveness, the washing away of sins by His blood (Rev. 1:5b). 
Just as a cancer patient wouldn’t deny treatment, neither should 
we sinners. I’m not a doctor, but I would like to share more 
information about this with you....

Come share in periods of life-changing Bible study and 
worship with us. We really do care about you, too!__________

Sunday Morning Bible Class..9:45a.m. Sunday Evening Worship....6:00p.m.
Sunday Morning Worship....10;45a.m. Wed. Evening Bible Study...7:00p.m.

Friends & Neighbors Caring In Jesus

G a r d e n

T ips
........................

By James N ichols
...........IllI M M I M n

Cross Plains Review
D eadlines

Ads Noon on Tuesday
Articles Noon on Monday

L i b r a r y

N o t e s

Statistics
October 9-13,2006 

Memorial:
Charles and Lou Rodenberger 

In Memory of Zora Mae 
Bryant 

Donations:
Bob and Patsy Pipes 
Tom and Arlene Stephenson 
Donations - Books:
James and Dora Warlick 
Charles and Lou Rodenberger 

Activity Report 
Patrons: 58
Programs: 21
Copies: 170
References: 3
Calls In: 4
Internet Users: 9

....................... .

C ro ss  P la in s  
G a r d e n  C lu b  

N ew s
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By Joyce Odom 
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Appreciation to Ann Strahan 
for the wonderful divinity candy, 
to Joyce Stewart for the cute 
Christmas tree and to Fredene 
Tennison for the delicious sweet 
potato cobblers and ice cream.

Praise God for the wonderful 
rain we had!

Do What You Can To Show 
You Care About Other People,

And You Will Make Our 
World A Better Place.

Cross Plains Review October 19,2006

Q u ip s , C l ips  &  C o m m e n t s
.. .......... i i i i n n i ......... HIM

IC\Y M osley

The Cross Plains Garden Club 
met October 13, at 2:00 p.m. for 
their regular monthly meeting at 
Julene Franke's office. The topic 
was "Harmony In Nature".

Eva Fleming, president, called 
the meeting to order and led 
the group in repeating "The 
Conservation Pledge".

Minutes of the previous meet­
ing were read by Joyce Odom. A 
financial report was given by Ju­
lene Franke, treasurer. She also 
passed out the "Vision of Beauty 
Calendars". Roll call was con­
ducted by Joyce and most mem­
bers answered with a plant they 
brought or a plant stake, which 
brought interesting discussion.

Julene, Chairman of the Flower 
Show, led a discussion about 
having the Flower Show and after 
much discussion, it was tabled for 
further talk.

A Plant Sale is to be scheduled 
for May 12, 2007.

District VIII Fall Convention in 
Abilene was cited but no date at 
the present time was given.

Eva presented the program 
"Bulbs, Dividing and Forcing". 
She demonstrated a dish stand 
filled with rocks or pebbles, 
placing the bulbs on top, then 
covering with water down to the 
bottom, or where roots begin. 
Then place in a dark place until 
roots appear. Then they can be 
brought out to the light for further 
growth and future blooming.

The door prize was conducted 
by Eva and won by Mary Ella 
Weaver. It was a spineless cactus 
leaf that could be used in cooking.

Refreshments were served from 
a table with the center piece being 
a lantana cutting which was a 
"show and tell". All members had 
brought refreshments that were 
delicious.

The meeting adjourned until 
November 11 at 9:00 a.m. for a 
trip to Abilene.

Members attending were James 
Nichols (who had to leave), Eva 
Fleming, Mary Ella Weaver, 
Mary Jones, Betty Beggs, Julene 
Franke and Joyce Odom.

Comments: Ooe-ooii-ching- 
chang-walla-walla-bing-bang 
(by Alvin and the Chipmunks)

"Trusty Travelers"

Do you have any idea what you 
would pack if you planned to fly 
out tomorrow morning if you 
were a squirrel?

*A small bag of fresh peanuts 
and a mint, coated in chocolate.

*A blue striped vest and cap.
*A little green Afghan my 

Grama made me for me. You 
know the one that says "Nuts to 
You!"

* Two comic books and a 
connect the dots book.
*Sunshades, so they'll know I'm 

a famous star.
Traveling can be a great deal of 

fun, if ye " if  you plan ahead and 
put a little money aside for 
emergencies and incidentails.

If you were a 4 year-old boy 
with a sweet disposition and you 
could take four people with you; 
who do you think you might take?

*My kiddy-garder teacher Ms. 
Leke.

*Bestest friend. Jay Bob and his 
pup. Scat.

*Rafe Jones and Mrs. Rafe 
Jones. She makes the best 
chocolate chip cookies.

*My Mama—she makes ev­
erything fun. She soothes all the 
hurts, snuggles us and gives us 
lots of hugs.

This young man should have a 
very good time. He'll probably 
raise some eyebrows along the 
way. Why? For one thing, look at 
the entourage accompanying 
him. There are some who will 
think mafia, and some with other 
ideas, but the most of them will 
smell money somewhere up 
north.

Maybe the state of Washington 
or .-perhaps - Oregon is. where a 
smart chipper beaver by the name 
of Buck would fly. Now Buck 
Magee is a real go-getter. He 
works hard all day. At night he

cuts logs— most any type wood. 
He might pack these items:

*Tooth brush.
*Extra, extra care tooth paste
*Pack up some tree stumps and 

large tree branches.
He's moving on and gonna build 

us a new dam with a special home 
inside. He will leave a large note 
inside that simply says," Leave it 
to Beaver."

These two little girls are pack­
ing for their grandfather who is 
going on a trip. This is what they 
packed so he could have a wild 
and joyous trip:

*His pipe tobacco and cigars.
*A big straw hat.
*Three marbles.
*A sack of jelly beans.
*Two lady bugs in a clear 

plastic box.
*His rod and reel.
Grandchildren always seem to 

know just exactly what their 
granddads, grandpas, papas, paw 
paws, gramps, gran-gran-grand- 
fathers and G.P. #1 want. Are you 
interested in that?

Hello there! My name is Calvin 
Chipmunk of the extended chip­
munk family. Today I'll be doing 
the packing for my cousin. His 
schedule is so short and jam- 
packed that he doesn't have time 
to do it himself.

You may know my cousin, he's 
a singing star and he has the cutest 
little buck-tooth smile. His name 
is Alvin. His singing group is 
"Alvin and the Chipmunks". 
Alvin has been with the group 
several years.

Here is what I will pack for the 
adventure Alvin is going on:

*Some bugs in dirt, wood chips 
and old thin slices of wood.

*Big lace-up boots with spikes.
*Wooden tooth picks for 

snacks.
*Tooth brushes (double the #

of)...........................™
*A small journal and 3 pens. ‘]j
*Hair brush to brush Alvin's 

tail.
Did you have fun????????

SENIOR CITIZENS
MENU

O C T O BE R  23 - 27
MONDAY - German Sausage w/ 
BBQ Sauce, Normandy Blend, 
Augratin Potatoes, Sugar Cookie, 
Bread
TUESDAY- Pinto Beans, 
Cucumber-Tomato Salad, 
Spinach, Apple Cobbler, 
Combread
WEDNESDAY - Pork Chops w/ 
Gravy, Whipped Potatoes,

Carrots, Pineapple Upside Down 
Cake, Roll
THURSDAY- Beef Stew, 
Peaches & Cottage Cheese, Pea 
Salad, Peanut Butter Cookie, 
Combread
FRIDAY -. Chili Cheese Dog 
on Bun, Pork-N-Beans, Coleslaw 
w/Raisins, Fmited Gelatin

2nd & 4th Domino Night (42/84) Begins at 5:00 p.m.

WE ARE PROUD TO SERVE OUR CROSS PLAINS, 
COTTONWOOD & SCRANTON MEMBERS 

WE ARE HERE TO MEET YOUR NEEDS
www.taylorelectric.com

Otis says weed your flower beds 
and work the soil where possible, 
then cover bare spots with mulch. 
Use pine mulch in beds around 
the house and cedar mulch in 
beds that border property or the 
lawn. Cedar mulch will help keep 
the fire ants under control.

VOTE
CUFF KIRKHAM

FOR
CALLAHAN CO. COMMISSIONER

PRECINCT 4
A CONSERVATIVE VOICE 

IN COUNTY GOVERNMENT
Pol. Ad. Pd. by Cliff Kirkham Campaign, Connie Kirkham, Treasurer, 20235 FM 2707, Cross Plains, Tx. 76443

I '

http://www.taylorelectric.com
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Cross Plains Included in Live 
Internet Broadcast of M arching 
Band Competitions in 2006

On October 21st, 24 high 
school marching bands will con­
verge on the Brady High School 
stadium for the annual GIL Re­
gion VII Band Marching Compe­
tition. The Cross Plains High 
School Band will take the field at 
11:20 a.m.

For the first time, families and 
friends of local high school band 
members who may not be able 
to attend the competition will be 
able to listen to the band's per­
formance live on the internet.

The entire Band Marching com­
petition will be broadcast live on 
KNELradio in Brady at 95.3 FM, 
and the broadcast will be carried 
live on the internet through

at
:h ttp ://

KNEL's website 
www.knelradio.com < 
www.knelradio.com/> .

KNEL radio has been broad­
casting the live performances of 
bands within its coverage area 
for several years. With the addi­
tion of the internet broadcast of 
the station's programming in 
2006, KNELhas expanded cov­
erage of the GIL Band Marching 
competition to include all 24 
schools participating.

To listen live via the internet, 
go to the KNEL web site at 
www.knelradio.com <http://  
www.knelradio.com/> , click on 
listen now for KNEL-FM. Broad­
cast of the Cross Plains High

School Band performance in the 
GIL marching competition by 
KNEL is being sponsored by 
Texas Heritage Bank, member 
FDIC.

The Cross Plains High School 
Band is one of 11 Class A school 
bands participating in the Octo­
ber 21st competition. The day's 
competition will also include 10 
Class AA, two Class AAA high 
school bands, and one Class 
AAAA high school band. The 
schedule for band competition 
is also available at 
www.knelradio.com <http;// 
www.knelradio.com/> under 
"Local Events."

Buffaloes Fall to Pirates
PLAYERS OF THE WEEK

DEFENSE OFFENSE
The Cross Plains Buffaloes 

scored first, but poor special 
teams play allowed Perrin-Whitt 
to put points on the board. The 
Buffaloes had 10 first downs and 
164 yards of offense. The Pirates 
had 18 first downs and 340 total 
yards.

Russell Thomas, Sr., DB
6 Tackles 
2 Assist

Thomas Estes, Sr., QB
10 carries/35 yards (ITD)
7 of 16 passing 96 yards

Rushing: Brice Bowden 11 
Carries/42 yards, Thomas Estes 
10/35 yards (ITD), Fili Vasquez 
5/11, Russell Thomas 3/9, Sean 
Williams 3/7, JJ Callaway 1/6 

Receiving: Russell Thomas 2 
Catches/50 yards, Fili Vasquez 2/ 
19, Brice Bowden 1/15, Mitchell 
Gibbs 1/6, Chris McBride 1/4 

Passing: Thomas Estes 7/16/96 
yards/21NT

Tackles: Russell Thomas 
6 Tackles/2 Assist, Zach Bennett 
5/2, Brice Bowden 4/1, Justin 
Dickson 3/0, Markus Maxwell 
2/0, Mitchell Gibbs 2/0, Thomas 
Estes 2/0 (1 Rec. Fumble), Cody

TAKE IT AND RUN—Thomas Estes (QB, #5) hands the ball to 
RB Fili Vasquez (#25) against Perrin-Whitt.

Hyles 2/0, Colton Manley 1/1, 
Jacob Melton 1/0, JJ Callaway

0/1, Steve Garrett 0/1.
Submitted by Coach Hagler

Commended Students in | l u n c h  m e ^  

the 2007 National Merit 
Scholarship Program

27

The principal, Jimmie Cearley, 
of Cross Plains announced today 
that Russell Thomas has been 
named a Commended Student 
in the 2007 National M erit 
Scholarship Program. A Letter of 
Commendation from the school 
and National Merit Scholarship 
Corporation (NMSC), which 
conducts the program, will be 
presented by the principal to this 
scholastically talented senior.

About 34,000 Commended 
Students throughout the nation 
are being recognized for their 
exceptional academic promise. 
Although they will not continue 
in the 2007 competition for 
Merit Scholarship awards. 
Commended Students placed 
among the top five percent of 
more than 1.4 million students

who entered the 2007 competition 
by taking the 2005 Preliminary 
SAT/National Merit Scholarship 
Qualifying Test (PSAT/NMSQT).

“Recognition of academically 
talented students and the 
key role played by schools in 
their development is essential 
to the pursuit of educational 
excellence in our nation,” 
commented a spokesperson for 
NMSC. “The young people 
being named Commended 
Students have dem onstrated 
outstanding academic potential 
by their strong performance in 
this highly competitive program. 
We hope that this recognition will 
help broaden their educational 
opportunities and that they will 
continue to pursue scholastic 
excellence.”
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2006-2007 KEY CLUB OFFICERS—The new President of 
Kiwanis Club, Lajeana Long (far left) presents the new Key 
Club Officers. IVeasury-Jake Estes (from second left), Repoiter- 
Shasta Bacon, Secretary-Starla Schaefer, President- 
Austin Dunaway, Vice-President-Russell Thomas, Kiwanis 
Ambassador-Justin Dickson. Officers that were available for 
photo were Wjeb Master-Jenny Lewis, Faculty Advisor- 
Ms. Charlene Fleming, and Kiwanis Advisor-Bob Pipes.

Cross Plains 
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MORE MONEY DONATED TO THE CROSS PLAINS VFD—  
Rachelle Allen (left), a student of Cross Plains and a member 
of Cross Plains Jr. FFA, presented Fire Chief Bob Harrell (right) 
with a check. The check was money that she received in this 
year’s stock show. Rachelle along with other Cross Plains 
youth watched our firemen working long hours putting 
out the fires. She wanted to do more for the men than just 
hand out water and food. So at the Callahan County Stock 
Show she draped her Grand Champion Lamb with Fire 
Chief Harrell’s fire department T-shirt, to Honor ALL 
The Grand Champion Men that worked so hard to save 
our town. Thank You for All Your Hard Work.

A n n u a l Jr. 
C lass F a ll 
F e s t i v a l  
S c h e d u l e d  
for Saturday, 
October 28th

Subscribe To The
W a iiis f  R fe ^ ie w

ADVERTISE
C  m .....

i f
CALL 

254-725-6111

^  116 S.E. ^
1ST STREET 

CROSS PLAINS, TX

Mesothelioma EXPERIENCE
COUNTS

Lawyers with over 80 years 
combined ejqsertise.

OCTOBER 23 
BREAKFAST 

MONDAY - Sausage, Biscuit, 
Gravy, Assorted Juice 
TUESDAY - French Toast 
Sticks, Sausage, Assorted Juice 
WEDNESDAY - Poptart, 
Yogurt, Assorted Juice 
THURSDAY - Cereal, Toast, 
Assorted Juice
FRIDAY - Donut, Yogurt, 
Assorted Juice

LUNCH
MONDAY- Chili Beans, Cheese 
Stick, Salad, Combread, Pears 
TUESDAY - Steak Fingers w/ 
Gravy, Mashed Potatoes, Peas & 
Carrots, Peaches, Rolls 
WEDNESDAY-Fiesta Stix w/ 
Cheese Sauce, Salad, Fresh Fruit 
THURSDAY- Grilled Cheese, 
Beef-Veg Soup, Crackers, Mixed 
Fruit
FRIDAY- Beef or Chicken Patty 
on Bun, Lettuce, Tomato, Pickles, 
Baked Fries, Cookie

The Fall Festival for 2006 
will be held October 28th at 
the Cross Plains High School 
old gym. The festival will start 
at 6:00 p.m. and will conclude 
at 9:00 p.m. We welcome 
everyone in the community and 
surrounding communities to 
attend this night of fun.

There will be several booths for 
children and adults. There will be 
a cakewalk with delicious baked 
goods and the exciting Bingo with 
great prizes. You can have your 
dinner with us also, there will be 
a concession stand.

The Costume Contest will be 
Birth to Pre-K, K to 6th grade, 7th 
to 12th grade and adults. Prizes 
will be awarded to the winners.

New to the festival this year will 
be a pumpkin carving contest. 
The pumpkin entry fee is $3 and 
you need to bring them to the 
festival by 7:00 p.m. Winners of 
the pumpkin carving,'costume 
contest, and the king and queen 
will be announced between 7:30 
and 8:00.

Remember boxes for the 
Festival King and Queen 
nominees are located at Jean’s, 
Dairy Queen and Texas Heritage 
Bank so come give your financial 
support. We hope everyone 
comes out and enjoys the 
festivities.

Submitted by Jr. Class

may occur 30 to 50 years after ex­
posure to asbestos. Many work­
ers were exposed from the 1940s 
through the 1970s. Industrial main­
tenance and operators are among 
those at risk for mesothelioma, 
throat cancer or lung cancer. Call 
us for professional insight.

R )^  A  Krebs, M.D., J.D.
Doctor-Lawyer in Full-time Law Practice

Richard A Dodd, LC. 
Timothy R Cappolino, PC.

Board Certified Personal Injury Trial l.aw and Civil Trial 
Law by the Texas Board of Legal Specialization

NO FEE FOR HRST VISIT 
CAMERON. TEXAS

1 -8 0 0 -4 6 0 -0 6 0 6
www.asbestoslaw.com
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D on’t Let T he End O f 
Summer Keep You From 
A M uch N eeded E scape

$ 9 9
PER NIGHT  

(p lus tax )

B E N Z E N E  A L E R T STOP LEG CRAMPS ^ ^ 1
BEFORE TH E Y  STOP YOU.

Calcet's*triple calcium formula is designed to help :
stop low calcium leg cramps. Just ask your pharmacist |

If you or a loved one has been diagnosed with Acute 
M yelogenous Leukem ia (AML) or M yelodysplastic 
Syndrom e (MDS), please call us today toll free at 1-866- 
369-3476 to discuss your legal rights.

@
TH E FOX LAW  FIRM, P .C  1-866-FOX-FIRM

Principal Office— Dallas, Texas WWW.FOXFlRM.COM. PHARMACAL
CAL-06901 Rev 009060 © 2006 Mission Pharmacal Company. All rights reserved.

Now through December 31, 2006, celebrate fall 
and winter at the Omni San Antonio Hotel. You’ll 
enjoy luxurious accommodations, breakfast for 
two and our convenient location ju st m inutes 
from the enchanting River Walk, shops at 
La Cantera, historic Alamo, Sea World of Texas 
and Six Flags Fiesta Texas. Gall 1-800-THE-OMNI 
and ask for the Fall Into W inter package.

O m n i ® S a n  A n t o n i o  H o t e l

9821  C olonnade Boulevard, San A nton io , TX 7 8 2 3 0  
210-6 9 1 -8 8 8 8  w w w .om n san anton io .com

offer valid 9/5/06 - 12/31/06. Based on availability. Not applicable to groups. Cannot 
be combined with other offers or discounts. ® 2006 Omni Hotels.

http://www.knelradio.com
http://www.knelradio.com/
http://www.knelradio.com/
http://www.knelradio.com
http://www.knelradio.com/
http://www.knelradio.com/
http://www.knelradio.com
http://www.knelradio.com/
http://www.asbestoslaw.com
http://WWW.FOXFlRM.COM
http://www.omnsanantonio.com


C ouncil Minutes-
The urgent need for another 

officer is now, since Don will be 
retiring within the next 12-18 
months and Cross Plains will 
be without police protection if 
something is not done very soon.

Not only is it dangerous for one 
officer to handle everything, but 
a new one will need training time, 
so time is of the essence.

*It was strongly suggested that 
there needs to be attractive 
incentive for a qualified officer to 
move to Cross Plains. Mark Ring 
suggested putting in a property 
tax to help fund a law officer. 
Ring added, "I really don't like 
taxes, but I wouldn't mind paying 
a tax if it meant more police 
protection. He related that in the 
past week or so, he's had' 2 gas 
cans stolen and his mother-in- 
law has had gas siphoned out of 
her vehicle.

Era Lee Hanke and Bob Pipes 
pointed out that Cross Plains 
would be eligible for more grants 
and have leverage in other areas if 
there was a property tax. Debbie 
stated that getting another 
business into town would help as 
well to supplement taxes. It was 
brought out that a good tax base 
means a safer city.

The idea of property taxes was 
tabled until the next meeting, so a 
breakdown of total appraised 
value for property within the city 
limits, as well as total exemptions 
and rates could be looked into 
before voting on the idea.

* In the Police Chiefs monthly 
report, there were 89 calls for 
service, or about 3 calls per day. 
These included 4 thefts, 4 
suspicious persons and 4 criminal 
mischief investigations, as well 
as 1 attempted burglary, 3 alarm 
responses and 1 gas drive off. 
There was 'hot-rodder' call and 2 
accidents. There were 2 calls for 
family violence, 3 for assault, 2 
harassment, 3 terroristic threats 
and 5 telephone harrassment 
calls. There were 3 gun shot calls 
and Don had to assist other 
agencies 3 times. In the judge's 
monthly report there were 108 
outstanding citations.

♦Councilman James Nichols 
brought up the idea of moving the 
senior citizens from their current 
building on Main Street to the 
American Legion building 
located at the comer of NE 1st 
Street and Beech. He stated that 
the upkeep and utilities on the 
Senior Citizens Center was just 
too high. He said that. "It cost 
$6,521 for upkeep a year. If 11 
seniors are using the Center to eat 
1 meal for 5 days, that's $592.81 
per person, per year.

Nichols suggested that the City 
rent the American Legion build­
ing and pay utilities on that, as 
well as the Veterans Memorial 
utilities, in exchange for use of 
their building to house the senior 
citizens. He added, "Just do 
away with the Senior Citizens 
building." Mayor Purvis asked if 
James had gotten with Kathy 
Anderson, Coordinator and 
Overseer of the Senior Citizens 
Center. Nichols stated that he 
had, but did not comment on 
how Kathy responded.

Gene Dillard, Councilman and 
Senior Citizens Representative, 
notified the Council, "There 
needs to be a lot of work done 
on that building." Nichols 
responded that there is already a 
double sink, dishwasher and ice 
box in the American Legion 
building. Dillard continued, 
"The front door and other doors 
need to be widened, the floor 
needs to be fixed, it's leaking on 
the East side, the carpet needs a 
lot of work. It's gonna take some 
money to fix all of that."

Audrey Purvis added that the 
ceiling also needs to be replaced. 
Dillard emphasized that all the 
doors need to be made 
handicapped ready. Debbie 
Gosnell asked if there were se­
niors in wheel chairs. Dillard told 
her that some used scooters to 
move around in.

Bob Pipes inquired about other 
groups that use the Center, such 
as the Quilting Club and Kiwanis, 
and wondered what they'll use. 
He and David Estes thought that 
perhaps they could use the Com­
munity Center for their meetings. 
Cindy Payne asked if the City 
would still rent it out after the 
seniors are somewhere else. 
Debbie replied that the City

hopes to sell it. She added, 
"Contrary to popular belief, the 
City only rents it out 4 or 5 times 
a year at $50 each time.

Mayor Purvis said that this 
proposal was something worth 
looking into and that forming a 
committee was might be a good 
idea. It was suggested that there 
be 2 representatives from the 
Council and 2 from the American 
Legion.

Gene Dillard volunteered to be 
on the committee, but Nichols 
moved to appoint a committee of 
himself and Jerry Cassle, saying, 
"This will be a good idea for 
everybody involved." Dillard 
replied, "I watch out for my 
people, the senior citizens up 
there. I pretty well fight for 
them."

♦The Hotel/Motel Tax was 
discussed. Debbie stated that 
there are only specific things that 
the tax can be spent on. Those that 
receive the money must provide a 
detailed budget, be able to 
explain where that money 
actually went and it must be spent 
on tourism for the City.

It was decided that 8% of the 
money that used to go to the 
Garden Club, would now go to 
the Roping Club, providing they 
provide the Council with a 
detailed budget, as well as an 
'actual year-to-date' financial 
statement, just as the other enti­
ties have. The Barbarian Festival 
Committee will receive 16%, 
Project Pride 16% and 60% will 
go to the Chamber of Commerce.

♦Cindy Payne updated the 
Council on the progress of the 
Veterans Memorial. She stated 
that the American Legion has re­
ceived enough money to com­
plete the project, but do not have 
enough to put in a sprinkler sys­
tem. They may have to install a 
couple of faucets to water the 
plantings and grass, if no one 
helps with a sprinkler system. She 
asked if the City would 
contemplate helping her with the 
utilities. "People have been great 
with donations and labor, but we 
won't have the money for utilities, 
we just need help with water and 
electricity,"

Cindy had written a letter to 
WTU asking them to consider 
furnishing electricity for 2 lamps 
and the floor light to keep the flag 
lit up at night. WTU responded 
that since the City of Cross Plains 
no longer uses them as their elec­
tricity provider, they would not 
make that donation for the Veter­
ans Memorial. Debbie said that 
she would contact their new pro­
vider, First Choice to see if they 
will help.

A rough estimate on what has 
been spent so far on the Memorial 
is as follows; $21,500 for the 7 
engraved slabs, $10,000 for the 
concrete, $300 each for the 2 
lights and $244 for the bricks. 
There has been $32,000 donated 
so far. They still need to install 
handrails. Mrs. Payne added that 
they hope to be finished 
by November 11th, which is 
Veterans Day.

♦The Council asked Debbie to 
contact the City Attorney regard­
ing the cleanup of the Callaway 
property. By general consent, 
Debbie is to ask him to move 
forward on the project and 
several other lots are still in non- 
compliance with the Nuisance 
Ordinance. Gosnell has con­
tracted 24 lots to be mowed and 
the mowing will start this week. 
The "Junked" Vehicle Ordinance 
is being ignored for the most part 
and the City is to contact James 
Tidwell about contracting to have 
"junked" vehicles moved.

♦On the ongoing subject of 
leasing the baseball/softball 
fields, Gosnell stated that she 
tried to call Superintendent 
Tennison, but could not reach 
him. She said she'd try again and 
would have the lease ready by the 
next meeting. James Ames had 
contacted her earlier in the week 
concerning the one lot at the soft- 
ball fields on the far West side 
that the City has yet to own. Mr. 
Ames has contacted the out of 
town owners and relayed that 
they want $2,500 to sell it. He 
asked that the City consider buy­
ing it so that they can move the 
fields around, build parking and 
do whatever else they choose, and 
not be working around someone 
elses property. Council voted to

purchase it.
♦Fire C hief Bob Harrell 

presented the Council with a 
picture of the new fire truck. He 
had the new truck outside and 
invited anyone who was 
interested to come out and view it. 
Someone asked if he'd give them 
a ride in it. He responded, "Sure! 
Let's go!" The Council declined, 
but thanked Mr. Harrell for 
coming.

♦David Estes, President of 
Texas Heritage Bank, asked the 
council for their approval to close 
West 1st Street from Main to the 
alley way on October 28th from 
8:00 a.m, to 5:00 p.m. to hold a 
75th Anniversary Party in honor 
of the bank. The actual time of the 
party will be from noon until 3 
p.m. There will be games and 
they will have a tent set up with a 
band and provide BBQ and 
sausage. He invited everyone to 
come and celebrate with them. 
David added, "We appreciate 
being a part of this community 
and look forward to many more 
years." His request was 
unanimously approved.

♦Executive Session lasted for 
an hour. It was reported that the 
payment to clean The Commu­
nity Center will increase from 
$35 to $52.50. Stuart Sowell's 
salary increased $100 due to his 
receiving his "C" Certification in 
Water.

♦The Council looked over a 
resolution relative to the problem 
if illegal aliens in the United 
States. By general consent that 
discussion was tabled.

♦Attending from the public 
were Era Lee Hanke, Peg Terrell, 
Cindy Payne Mark Ring, Terry 
Lichty, David Estes, Bob 
Kirkham, Bob Harrell, Bob Pipes 
and DeVerle Harp.

If any citizen would like to 
know what is on the agenda at the 
next meeting, it will be posted at 
least 72 hours before the meeting 
on the front door of City Hall. The 
public is encouraged to attend.

The Cross Plains City Council 
meets every 2nd Tuesday at 6:30 
p.m. at City Hall, located at 
7th and Main Street.

Grand Ole Oplin 
Announce Band 
Schedules
The Grand Ole Oplin would 

like to invite everyone out this 
coming Friday night, October 
20th, to listen and dance to the 
music of the Yellowjackets 
(many of your folks know this 
band as Herman Hermes), they 
play good  old fa sh io ned  
country dancing music. We 
would also like to invite 
everyone out to our annual 
Halloween dance to be held on 
F r i d a y ,  O c t o b e r  2 7 t h  
(costumes are encouraged but 
optional), Muddy Creek will be 
here to play all your favorite 
tunes wearing their favorite 
costumes.

The Grand Ole Oplin is located 
at the intersection of FM 604 S. 
and FM 2926. Smoking and 
alcohol is not allowed at any of 
our functions. Everyone is 
invited to bring a snack to be 
enjoyed by all during the band's 
break. Our dances begin at 7:30 
p.m. each Friday evening, and 
end at 10:30 p.m. Admission to 
our dances is still $4:00 per 
person.

So gather the family and all 
your friends and come on out to 
the Grand Ole Oplin and don't 
forget to wear your costumes on 
October 27th for our Halloween 
dance.

Subscribe To The 
Cross Plains Review

Cross Plains 
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HUTCHINS FAMILY— Ĵayln and Jaryn Koenig (from left), Alvin and Vondean Hutchins, | 
Duane and Susan Hutchins and son Aron.

MEMORIAL WALK TO THOSE WHO WERE LOST TO CANCER—Flashlights and 
glow-in-the-dark lights were held as Bro. Ronnie White read the list of names. Arm in arm are 
Larry and Sandra Crockett (from left), Claud Champion, Frances and Don Thornton.

t

jUNITED SUPERMARKET HOSTED A FOOD BOOTH— Ophelia M errill was their 
[representative. (Cancer Walk photos courtesy of Teresa Koenig.)

C ancer Walk-
Oscar Koenig and Larry Crock­
ett; Methodist Church group, 
Bro. Jim Senkel; Cottonwood 
Baptist Church Praise Team, Bro. 
Matt McGowen; Living Water 
Ministries Praise Team, Bro. 
Max Evans; Kiwanis; Barbarian 
Festival group; Project Pride; 
Beta Sigma Phi; Board of 
Directors of Cross Plains Public 
Library;YWCA of Abilene; 
Girling Health Care Services; 
Tina Wyatt and Vera West 
Women's Services; United Gro­
cery in Abilene; KOXE Radio in 
Brownwood; Stephanie Strick- 
land-The Clown; Cross Plains 
High School Student Groups and 
Sponsors; Cross Plains I.S.D. and 
Mrs. Jackie Tennison; plus all the

volunteers.
In addition to raising money, 

Larry Crockett and James Oscar 
Koenig were asked to speak on 
behalf of caregivers and patients, 
to tell part of their story and share 
some words of comfort to those 
who are also battling cancer.

Crockett, who spoke on behalf 
of caregivers, began by saying 
that caregiving starts a long time 
before cancer does. He went on to 
say that caregiving begins when 
you befriend someone and sup­
port them. By the time someone 
develops cancer the caregiving is 
like second nature. Larry's wife, 
Sandra, was diagnosed with can­
cer in 1990 and is currently 
recovering and doing well.

Speaking on behalf of patients, . 
Koenig began his talk by saying • 
that when he was younger the 
thought he was invincible and - 
that "things like that don't happen . 
to us," but "then all of a sudden it's ; > 
your time." Koenig, who previ- 
ously had no medical problems, ; . 
was told by his doctor that he had 
a tumor growing in his brain.

"This thing has a name," he said > 
and laughed, "It is longer than my ‘ ̂  
short story."

Koenig says that he never lost *. 
hope, and finished by reading a ' 
poem he had framed:

"Cancer is so limited.
It cannot cripple love.
It cannot shatter hope. ;' 
It cannot erode faith."

ommunity Wide Sale
SATURDAY, OCTOBER 21 

IN CROSS PLAINS
STOP AT fflGH SCHOOL PAVILION TO 

OBTAIN MAP AND LOCATIONS OF ALL SALES

YARD/GARAGE SALES 
OTHER SPECIAL In-Store SALES:

Look for these and other retail merchants on the Participants Map
Dub Meador Flea Market 

Higginbothams 
Johnson’s Dry Goods*

Lawrence Farm & Ranch Supply 
Staghorn Cafe 

Subway Sandwich Shop 
Sun Rayz’s Tanning & Gifts 

Taste of Texas
Sponsored by Beta Sigma Phi

Proceeds of BSP Yard Sale used for Service Projects and Scholarships 
(Items for sale include wood filing cabinets, entertainment center, furniture)

♦ Johnson’s everyday prices are already competitive and can’t be beat!
One of a few independently owned small clothing stores remaining in Texas.
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A VOTE FOR ELVAN GOODE IS A VOTE FOR 
10 YEARS EXPERIENCE WITH THE 

COUNTY AND A KNOWLEDGE OF HOW 
THE SYSTEM WORKS.

HIS PLATFORM IS BETTER. WIDER ROADS 
FOR EVERYONE-FARMERS, RANCHERS, 

SCHOOL BUSES-EVERYONE.
HOW ABOUT IT FRIENDS AND 

NEIGHBORS-LET’S GIVE HIM AN 
OPPORTUNITY TO IMPROVE OUR 

ROAD SYSTEM AND BRIDGES.
Political A d  Paid F o r  B y The Albrecht G irb , R L  1, C r a «  Ptaiae, T X  7C443

Surprise Party 
Honors 80 
Year-Old Lady

Bobbie Mae Casey was honored 
at a surprise birthday party by 
her friends and relatives. The 
celebration was held at the 
Pioneer Baptist Church in Pio­
neer, Texas.

Mrs. Casey was bom in the 
Panhandle of Texas and later 
settled in the Sabanno 
Community. She has five 
daughters and one son.

A birdbath was her gift from her 
guests.

TAG President making personai 
visit to honor Callahan County

N O T IC E  O F  G E N E R A L  E L E C T IO N  
(A V IS O  DE E L E C C IO N  G E N E R A L )

To the registered voters of the County of Callahan, Texas:
(a !os votantes registrados de l Con dado de Callahan, Texas)
Notice is hereby given that the polling places listed below will be open 
from 7:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. November 7th, 2006, for voting in a general 
election to elect presidential electors. Members of Congress, Members 
of the Legislature, and state, district, county and precinct officers:. 
(Notifiquese, p o r las presente, que las caslllas electorales sitados abajo 
seabrian desdelas 7:00a.m . hastalas 7:00p.m . e!7th denoviem bre de 
2006para votaren !a Elecclon General para electores presidenciales, 
Miembros de! Congreso, MIembros de !a Legislature, y  oficiales de l 
estado, distrito, con dado y  de! prednto.
LOCATIONS OF POLLING PLACES 
(DIRECCIONES D E  LAS CASILLAS ELECTORALES)
Precinct #1 - Clyde Lions Club 
Precinct #2 - Eula Lions Club 
Precinct #3 - Baird Housing Authority 
Precinct #4 - Cross Plains Community Center 
Precinct #5 - Putnam Community Center 
Precinct #6 - Southside Baptist Church, Clyde 
Precinct #7 - Oplin Community Center
Early voting by personal appearance will be conducted each weekday at: 
(La votacion adelantado enpersona se Hevara a cabo de lanes a viernes 
en:)
Baird— County Courthouse Room #102 
Clyde— Justice of the Peace Office 
Cross Plains— Justice of the Peace Office 
(location) (sitio )

Recommended but not required

between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. beginning on October 
23 ,2006
(entre las 8:00 !e !a manana y  las 5:00 de !a tarde empezando e ! 
O ctober28, 2006,) {6a\e) (fecha)
and ending on Novembers, 2006 (yterm lnandoelN ovem ber3,2006) 
(date) (fecha)
Applications for ballot by mall shall be rriailed to:
(Las solicitudes para botetas que se votaran adelantado porcorreco  
deberan enviarse a.)

Jeanie Bohannon 
(Name of Early Voting Clerk)
(Nombre de l Secretario de la  Votacion Adelantada)
100 West 4th, Suite 104^
(Address) (D ireccion)
Baird, Texas 79504
(City) Ciudad) (Zip Code) Zona Postal)

Applications for ballots by mall must be received no later than the close 
of business on: October 31 ,2006.
(Las solicitudes para botetas que se votaran adelantada pro  correco 
debran recibirsepara e lfin  de tasthoras de negocio e i)  O ctober31, 
2006.
(date) (fecha)

Issued this the 10th day of October, 2006 
(Emitada este dia 10th de October, 2006.)

(s) Roger Corn 
Signature of County Judge 

(Firma detJuez de l Condado)

Texas Association of Counties 
President Marc Hamlin will visit 
the Callahan County Commis­
sioners Court at 11:30 a.m. 
October 23rd to personally honor 
the county for its recent Best 
Practices award from the TAC 
Leadership Foundation.

Callahan County’s prestigious 
award for Exceptional Delivery 
of Service is among 17 pre­
sented to 14 counties through 
the Leadership Foundation’s 7th 
Annual “Best Practices” awards 
for extraordinary innovations, 
achievements and effective 
management in county govern­
ment. TheTexas Association of 
Counties (TAC) is a statewide 
organization whose members are 
county government officials in 
all 254 counties of Texas. Its 
Leadership Foundation serves 
as an educational resource for 
county officials.

“These award-winning pro­
grams have shown a marked 
increase in customer service or 
productivity, performances that 
go the extra mile and county 
leadership in the best of terms,” 
said Randall County Tax Asses­
sor-Collector Carol Autry, chair 
of the foundation board and TAC 
board member.

TAC’s President Marc Hamlin 
is Brazos County district clerk.

Callahan County received its 
award in technology for its net­
work and telecommunications 
program that provided life- and 
property-saving services during 
the huge wildfires of 2005.

When raging wildfires spread 
around Cross Plains in fall 2005, 
the Callahan County emergency 
dispatch system was inundated 
with calls, more calls than there 
were phones in the dispatch area. 
Thanks to the county’s brand 
new central phone network, 
however, there was flexibility to 
move more phones to the area 
so that frightened citizens were 
not put on hold.

Such modern communication 
would not have been possible in 
the small West Texas county 
two years earlier because there 
was no network of computer 
and phone system s. Judge 
Roger Corn initiated the project 
because the county had such a 
patchwork of systems in the 
various county offices that Corn 
was concerned about produc­
tivity, customer service and 
costs.

The judge worked with a Plano 
company and other elected offi­
cials to figure out the county’s 
needs and the costs. The group 
made a list of goals and has met 
every one of them. Importantly

H elp in g  H earts, H elp in g  
Hands Work Day Scheduled 
for Saturday, October 28

for taxpayers, a thorough re­
view of the county’s bills for the 
old patchwork of systems re­
vealed that the $118,000 needed 
for new computer and phone 
networks could be paid for 
through reduced costs of the old 
systems -  plus an estimated 
$100,000 in savings over the life 
of the new systems.

The new phone network has 
freed up employees to better 
serve residents in person, as w$ll 
as allowing citizens to ac ce^  
information lines after hours. Tl|s 
new computer network allovls 
county employees to better sha|e 
records between offices. The ne|v 
system has been particularly sii- 
nificaFit-for the sheriff’s offici, 
where reliability and saving tim|2 
are of the utmost importance!

The TAC Leadersh 
Foundation’s board of directors 
consists of Randall County T ^  
Assessor-Collector Carol Autry, 
chair; Brazos County District 
Clerk and TAC President Marc 
Hamlin; Kaufman County Judge 
Wayne Gent; Harris County Con­
stable Ron Hickman; Navarro 
County Justice of the Peace 
Connie Mayfield; Tarrant County 
Tax Assessor-Collector Betsy 
Price; Tom Green County Trea­
surer Dianna Spieker; and former 
Dallas County Commissioner 
Roy Orr, ex-officio member.

Cross Plains Review

The Cross Plains Area Housing 
Initiative has set their annual 
Helping Hearts, Helping Hands 
work day for Saturday, October 
28. This annual event enlists 
the support and work of local 
volunteers to do minor repairs 
on area resident’s homes to help 
improve the quality of their 
living area. Those applying must 
meet the requirement of being 
elderly or low income.

Volunteers are needed to help in 
accomplishing this year’s 
projects. We currently have 
around 17 projects to complete in 
this one day event. All ages are 
encouraged to help out as we 
work together toward helping 
out those in need in our 
area. Breakfast and lunch will 
be provided. Volunteers are 
encouraged to call Connie 
Kirkham at 725-6550 or Roxie 
Thomas at 725-6141 to let us 
know if you will be able to help 
so we can provide a head count 
for those that will be providing 
the meals. But, if you get up on 
October 28th and find you are 
able to work and have not 
notified us, we want to invite you 
to come and join us anyway. All 
volunteers are welcome and will 
be used.

If you cannot help by being 
a volunteer, donations are 
encouraged as we can use money 
to purchase materials for 
completion of these jobs.

This project has been in 
existence for several years, and it 
always proves to be an enjoyable 
day as residents of all ages 
work together to improve the 
quality of life for those who need 
some assistance. We guarantee 
whether you give money, work on 
the projects or deliver water to 
those who are working, you 
will walk away with a blessing

Subscribe To The 
Cross Plains Review

from having contributed to this 
worthwhile cause. We look 
forward to seeing you there.

Submitted by 
Roxie Thomas
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m  CREDIT CARD REQUIRED!
- BEST DEAL EVER  - _

Get ALL 250+ Channels FREE for 
4 months with NFL Sunday Ticket 

r- Includes ALL Movie ChannelsD I R E C T V .

FREE 1 4  Room System 
FREE Installation 

FREE DVR (Ask How)

Call Now 1-800-574-1938

What Will Your Creditors Accept 
To Settle Yotir Debt?

CALL US TO FIND OUT
1 -8 0 0 - 7 9 4 - 9 7 0 0

Your Ufe should be more than 
aeditors, collectors and attorneys.

We will help you take control of your finances 
and yovu hiture by settling your debts todj^.
m029

C o r p

The Rrst 25 Callers 
Who Enroll In Our 

Program Will Receive 
A Free Caller ID Manager

(KeuUVUii.; 199.97)

F R E E n n O F T H EOPEN ROAD
• Experience rewarded but not 

required
• Company-provided CDL training 

for qualified candidates
• $33,500-$60,500 (depending 

on experience)
• Immediate benefits for 

experienced drivers

Apply Online at
schneideriobs.com

Or call
1-800-44-PRIDE

(1-800-aa7-7433l

S Q W E ^ ^ ,

Clyde Hardware & Supply
119 Pecan Clyde, Tx. 7 9 5 1 0
325 -8 9 3 -4 2 6 0  Fax: 3 2 5 -893 -5262

HOURS: M0N.-FRI. 7:30 AM TO 5:3 0  PM SAT. 7:30 AM T 0 12:30 PM 
email: cpcrais@msn.com imp://clvdeliarilware.bigcountrvliiz.c^

LE T S  GO DOVE HUNTING!

Herniated Disc? 
Degenerative Disc? 

Sciatica?
Free report reveals a new FDA approved non-surgical solution 
for serious and chronic low back pain. For your free report 
entitled, "How Space Age Technology Is Solving Back Pain 
Without Drugs or Surgery" call 1-800-856-7482 (Toll-free 24 
Hour recorded message), or go to:

www.911sorediscsecrets.com

■ ■  IZ-wZIhGAUSE 
* „  SMTSHOIS

SHOTCUN 
SHEUS IN 
STOCK -

license available for 2006-2007

Hunling ^  Fishing
License - All Stamps

BACKWOODS CUTTER 6gzsmy$5.69

OSCULATING FANS FOR THE 
CABIN AT THE LEASE!

mailto:cpcrais@msn.com
http://www.911sorediscsecrets.com


HAPPY BIRTHDAY!
Right now, it doesn’t look much like a birthday party.

But on October 28th, 
from 12 noon to 3 o’clock, 
there will be bands playing, 

people dancing or playing games.
And a barbeque plate for anyone that wants one. 

Even some drawings for special prizes.

> , . A -

We’ll be celebrating our 75th birthday.
And we want to have a good time.

And since our having a good time means 
making certain that you have a good time...

well.... put a reminder on your calendar,
and come on down.

See for yourself.

Texas 
Heritage

Member
FDIC

8  ^  f  ^



CROSS PLAINS REVIEW CLASSIFIED ADS
116 S.E. 1st Street - P.O. Box 519 - Cross Plains, Texas 76443-(254) 725-6111

Cross Plains Review Only - $3.00 for up to 20 words. 20jd each additional word. 
Card of Thanks - $3.00 & up.

Classifieds must be received in the review office by noon Ihesday to be published in 
the current week’s edition.

The Cross Plains Review reserves the rights to reject any and all Classitied Ads considered 
by the publisher to be subject objectional in matter, phraseology, or opposed to the interest or 
the policy of the newspaper. No fraudulent, dishonest, or misleading ads will be knowingly 
published in the Cross Plains Review for any cost, injury or liability upon it because of the 
content of any ad so submitted.

BUSINESS SERVICES H E L P  W A N TED

WATERWELL DRILLING 
Pump Sales & Service 

TX Lie 1864PKW 
Jimmy D. Wilson 

(254) 725-6120
M ODERN  

HOUSE LEVELING
THE PROFESSIONAL 

LEVELING CO.
(325) 643-4767

_____ Brownwood
DON’T SLEEP WITH 

A DRIP! 23tfc
Sewer Machine, Trencher 

and Ditching Machine 
We can do it all for you 
Call (254) 725-6616 or 

(325) 668-0686 
For Your Plumbing Needs 
PRIVATE SITTER 

Very Experienced For Elderly 
And Disabled 

Many References 
Call Barbara Thomas 

(254) 725-7657
Johnsons Wrecker 

Service
24 Hour Service 

Danny Johnson 
254-725-7777 

Available Now

CARPENTERS/CARPENTER 
H E L P E R S / L A B O R E R S  
NEEDED- Lots of work to do; 
Call 325-660-9805 or 254-725-
7363.3itfc___________________
R ISIN G  STAR NURSING 
C EN TER , has a Full-Time 
Position open for a CNA; Please 
call Minta or Lori at 254-643-
2681.31-2tc___________________
CO-M ANAGER WANTED-
DQ of Cross Plains now hiring 
for a Co-Manager. Looking for 
individual to assist General 
Manager in all areas of operation. 
Advancement opportunities 
available. Non-smoking, drug 
free environment. Call Carol at 
940-549-5041. 31-4tc

GARAGE SALES

28-4tp

CHILD CARE
NEED A DEPENDABLE 
BABY-SITTER?- Please call 
Tabitha Sutton, 325-668-3340, 
for details. 3o-2tc

REAL ESTATE
NEW 3 BEDROOM, 2 BATH 
HOUSE - At 125 South Ave E, 
Cross Plains; $88,900; Call 254- 
725-7657 or 325-260-8505.3i-3tp 
3 TO 4 BEDROOM HOUSE - 
On 2 lots; water well, storage 
bldg; Located at 333 NE 7th, 
Cross Plains;Needs repairs; Call 
254-725-7557.29tfc

GARAGE SALE- Saturday, 
October 21; 9-?; Some Antiques;
1 miles east on Hwy 36 (at 
Pointer’s). 3i-itc
GARAGE SALE- The sale at 
Aaron’s Place at Atwell will take 
place now at the American Legion 
Hall in Cross Plains in order to 
participate in the Community 
Wide Sale; Friday & Saturday 
from 8 to 4; Crafts, craft supplies, 
guns, household and do dad 
items, Meade 4 1/2 (Large) 
Telescope like new. 3i-itc
2 FAMILY GARAGE SALE- 
Saturday, October 21; 8-4; 125
S. Ave D. 31-itp_______________
GARAGE SALE- Saturday, Oct. 
21st; 8AM; 401 N. Ave C. (home 
of Era Lee Hanke); Antique 
iron bed, quilt, luggage, chest, 
glassware, weed eater, lots of 
great stuff. 3i-itp
YARD SALE- Saturday, October 
21; 9-?; 5 miles north of Cross 
Plains on Hwy 206; Christmas 
decorations, household items and 
more. 3i-itp

FLEA M ARKETS
BLOCK ONE 

FLEA MARKET
Open Thursday, Friday and 
Saturday at 301 East Pecan in 
Coleman, ufe

RUSSELL - SURLES TITLE, INC.
TITLE INSURANCE - ABSTRACTS 

CLYDE-BAIRD
Representing: Alamo Title, First American Title and United General 

Clyde, Texas Baird, Texas
120 Oak Street 337 Market St.
P.O. Box 499 P-O. Box 938

Clyde, TX 79510 Baird, TX 79504
Ph: (325) 893-4227 Ph: (325) 854-1115
Fax: (325) 893-4229 Fax: (325) 854-1459

President: Andrew Ladyman, Attorney

YOUR ROAD TO A NEW CAREER!
• Paid CDL Training!
• No Experience Needed!
• Earn $35 - $75K Yearly!
Stevens Transport offers the best
comprphpn<;ivp training program for new
drivers! Get your career rolling and enjoy 
exceptional earnings and great benefits 
from the #1 premier transportation carrier!

Steujsn/^ ^ i a/iAfi/>A£
lor more information, caii
800-333-8595

w w  w  . s t  e V e n s t  r a n s p o r t . c o m

Hiring for Bandag
lO.OO/hr.

Shift Work
Stable Work H istor

Math Skills
Strong Work Ethic

Contact:
Manpower

500 S. Chestnut. Suite 1633 
325- 677-2065

EOE

CARD OF THANKS

FOR SALE
OLD W OODEN BED 
FRAME, (half-bed), $10.00; Pair 
of Taskeo Binoculares, $10.00; 
Digital Camera with WebCam 
features never used, $10.00; 
Homemade Cheerleading suit, 
size 3-4, $10.00; Call 254-725- 
4732.31-itp
CEDAR POST FOR SALE-
Available now in Cross Plains 
(head west on Hwy 36 will be on 
your left); I am also interested in 
buying Cedar; Call Wilton 
Daughterey 512-581-1660. 29-4tp 
SA 200 LIN CO LN  
PORTABLE WELDER- Call
254-725-7454. stfc__________ _
ROUND HOUSE BLUE 
DENIM  BIB OVERALLS- 
Hammer loops and pencil slots; 
button fly; $24.99; Johnson’s 
Dry Goods, Cross Plains, 254- 
725-6211.3M.C
iitfc For Your

Mary Kay Cosmetics 
or a FREE Facial 

Contact
Sue Taylor-Neal

Mary Kay Beauty Consultant
254-725-7532

FOR RENT
2 BED RO O M , 1 BATH
HOUSE - Newly remodeled, 
washer/dryer connections, fenced 
back yard, deposit required, $300 
monthly; Call 254-725-6111 or 
325-665-8481.3i.fc

HIRING NOW! 
Martin Sprocket

Hiring for all shifts 
Temp/Hire 

Full benefit package 
Apply at Manpower 

500 Chestnut 
Abilene, TX 

(325)677-2065 EOE

WANTED
WANTED - Responsible party 
to take on small monthly 
payments on High Definition Big 
Screen TV, 1-800-398-3970.3o-2tp 
GRAZIN G WANTED IN 
CROSS PLAINS AREA -Any­
one interested in leasing out their 
place; I will pay top dollar for a 
good place; Call Dean Dillard 
254-725-7275.23tfc 
OLD CARS & TRUCKS - 
Classics; Any kind of scrap metal, 
Call 254-725-7671.9tfc
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EXPERT BODY WORK AND PAINTING
... V ____

, 2 0 0 ^

B A R R E T T  C O L L ISIO N  C E N TER
CLAUD CHAMPION 

(325) 677-2924 
(FAX) 677-4601

ROCKY CHAMPION  
214 North Leggett 

Abilene, Texas 79603

We would like to thank the 
Baptist Church for their beautiful 
facilities and each and every 
person who helped make 
Tommie’s birthday celebration so 
great. We love you all!

Phyllis and Tommie Harris
CARD OF THANKS

The Community Cancer Prayer 
Walk was a success because of so 
many people coming together 
with one common goal—to show 
support for our neighbors who 
have been touched by Cancer. 
To the following people, I am 
grateful to have worked along 
side you to provide such an event 
that blessed our town:
First Baptist Church groups, 

Bro. Ronnie White; Church of 
Christ group, Bro Bob Pipes, 
James Oscar Koenig, Larry 
Crockett; M ethodist Church 
group, Bro Jim Senkel; 
Cottonwood Baptist Church 
Praise Team, Bro Matt 
McGowen; Living Water Praise 
Team, Bro Maxey Evans; 
Kiwanis; Barbarian Festival 
group; Project Pride; Beta Sigma 
Phi; Board of Directors, Cross 
Plains Public Library; YWCA of 
Abilene; Girling Health Care 
Services; Tina Wyatt and Vera 
West Women’s Services; United 
Grocery in Abilene; KOXE 
Radio in Brownwood; Stephanie 
Strickland-The Clown; Cross 
Plains High School Student 
groups and sponsors; Cross Plains 
ISD, Mr. Jackie Tennison; Cross 
Plains Review, All the volunteers.

May God bless each and every 
one of you!
Kathy Purvis

The V in e
MaW ng &

Framing
(By ^

Tom (Mary (Dunn

(254) 725-7136

Sprinkler Systems 
Installation & Service 

LI 7119
TURNER LANDSCAPE 

IRRIGATION 
(254) 725-7755 
(325) 669-5553 

WATER WELLS
Sales & Service

I

R ic k C a r o u ^  \mK-9 ^ w t s
Backhoe

. . &
Forklift Service

Sand & Gravel Hauling 
Rickey Carouth 
(254) 725-7515 

Mobile (325) 660-3207 
Cross Plains, Texas

\  D U N N ’S 
1 BLADE WORK

36tfc
Doing All Types of 

Grader Work
Farm, Ranch, Commercial

Pet Salon
Offering:Baths and specialty baths 
Flea, shedding and dandruff control 

clipping, trimming and scissor cuts 
Ear cleaning and toe nail clipping

Susan Saunders 
254-725-7245

101 Tom Bryant Cross Plains, TX

Steve Propest 
insurance

NOW SELLING
Mouthy Auto Liability 

Low Down Payment 
Motorcycle-Mobile Homes 

Motor Homes

1-254-725-4747
140 South Main

51tfc C r o s s P la in s j ^ ^

Dr. Devin Koenig, D.C. 
1510 State Hwy 206 
(254) 442-4878

325-624-5548 (Home) 
325-214-0269 (Cell)

REFLEXOLOGY
Pressure Point 

^  Therapy 
^  30 Years Experience

i --------
i  Call 254-725-6671

44-4 to

m  CAROUTH \

Specialized treatments for 
back pain, headaches, 

stress, allergies.

Metal Buildings, 
Custom Homes, 

and Cabinets
Rickey Carouth 
(254) 725-7515 

Mobile (325) 660-3207 
Cross Plains, Texas

Abilene Auto Doctor
4126 7^ 1st St. 
'Â ifene, T'txas 

325-677-2886 (Auto)

ASE Master Certified 
L1 Engine Performance

Local Owners:
Scott £r Karman W yatt

For A ll Your Autom otive Needs

To Advertise In 
This Space 

Call
The Cross 

Plains Review  
At

254-725-6111

Steel & Vinyl Siding 
Over Hang Coverage 

Metal Roofing 
Replacement Windows 

Carports Patio Covers
A-1

Home Improvements
www.a 1 homei mp.coin

Local Sales Rep, Bob Kirkham

325-280-0005 
Main Office 325-784-82571

Lanier BUILDING & 
Concrete CoNSTRuenoN
Remodeling Add-ons 
Cabinets

Gary Lanier
Home: 254-725-4992 
Cell: 325-642-8554

6750 CR411 West 
tfc Cross Plains, TX 76443

A U T O W IR E
Get those troublesome 

wiring problems fixed on 
your pickup, trailer, RV, 

Car, tractor, or accessories 
Fix It Once!
Fix It Right!

105 W. College Rising Star 
(254) 643-6255 

1-888-FIX-WIRE

T & K TIRE 
& ALIGNMENT

300S.W.5th 
Cross Plains, TX 76443

(254) 725-6223
General Auto Repairs 
Tractor or Truck Tires 
Front-End Alignment 

Brakes

Annie’s 
Pest Control

Your Complete 
Extermination Service

Call Cell ^

254-631-2355
P. O. Box 397  

Cross Plains, Texas 76443

WATER WELL 
DRILLING

Drilled & Completed to 
State Specifications 

Test Holes 
Pump Installation 

TX License #1864PKW 
35 years drilling experience

Jimmy D. Wilson 
(254) 725-6120

Cross Plains
B u siness Service
Income Tax Preparation 

E-File Available 
Accounting

Julene Franke
(254) 725-7712 
(254) 725-7434

Cross Plains 
Parts Plus

Auto Parts, Etc.
We Make 

Hydraulic Hoses

254-725-4471
125 North Main Street

Pointer Tile ̂  
Construction
Tile Floors, Showers 

Bathroom 
Kitchen Remodels 
Cast Iron Bathtub 

Refurbishing and More

Call Barry 
(254) 653-7441

FORTUNE
CONSTRUCTION

Licensed sej>tie System installer

Dom, Backhoê  Truck
Trenching and D irt Construction
Trey Home 254-725-4569 

Cell 325-665-5725 
Steve Home 254-725-7307 

Cell 325-669-6984

alace D ru g ||
---------- i

I
Prescriptions

Deliver Monday - Friday
Major Insurance 

Medicaid-Medicare Part D 
Prescription

Gifts - .991 Cards
254-643-3231

i

REED
CONSTRUCTION W
When In Need Call Reed ^

Concrete - Painting ^  
Tape & Bed & Texture ^
Home (254) 725-7363 m

A R A
A L L  R IG S  
& A U T O S

MECHANIC 
DIESEL AUTO 
A/C MAINTENANCE

105 WEST COLLEGE 
RISING STAR, TX 76471

http://www.a


JONES REAL ESTATE 
(254) 725-6163

ROLAN JONES, BROKER 
CRYSTAL DAVIS, AGENT 325-370-7790

Email: rlestate@crossplains.com - Webpage: www.crossplains.com

HAVE BUYERS NEED LISTINGS
ACREAGE WITH HOME;
NEW LISTING-Cute 2BD/1B farm l)gusfijo^.66/A, completely remodeled, new electrical, new plumbing, 
new tile floors. Must See! Great Price ot Only,̂ 35,000.
NEW LISTING-16/A with 3/2 Mobile Home, 4/A Coastal Bermuda grass, 12/A wooded, good hunting, goQd 
fences, 2 tanks, county road frontage. Oaks, Pecan, Peach, Apricot Trees. $70,000.
NEW LISTING-Approx. 38/A with a 1,251 sq.ft., 3BD/1B home, metal roof, fire place, CH/A, Its of trees, 
several small bams and pens, 2 w atg^J^J^n pavement, 30+ acres Coastal Bermuda, pond, feed & tack room, 
excellent location, Callahan County. $135,000
NEW LISTING!!!!!Beautiful 200/A with 3 single family residences, office. Indoor Arena with water misting 
dust control system, 9 stall horse bam. Tack Room, 22X30 shop, Utility/Storage Bam, 75X40 Storage Bam 
with restroom facilities, wash rack, dog kennel, 5 water wells, 6 septic systems, cross fenced. Coastal Bermuda 
Grass, wildlife food plot, 4 tanks. Great Hunting, Good 6 wire barbed wire fences, Post Oak, Live Oak, 7 miles 
East of Cross Plains. ONLY $995,000. MUST SEE!!!
RESIDENTAL:
NEW LISTING-New Construction 1,320 sq.ft., 3BD/2B on large lot in Cross Plains, near school, in new 
home area. $80,000
NEW LISTING-4BD/2B Brick, CH/A, on 3/4 acre, large oak trees, patio, cathedral ceiling, sunken living 
room, Berber carpet & tile floors, oak cabinets, fireplace, Levelor blinds, mostly new appliances, on pavement, 
100’ X 140’ horse pens with 12’ X 40’ shed with tack and feed room, 3 car detached carport, located in Cross 
Plains. ONLY $145,000.
NEW LISTING-3BD/2B, 2,520 home on 2 lots in Rising Star. Metal roof, 2 storage sheds, on
pavement, in town, & water well. Pn&oWsell $29,500
* 3BD/2B 1,800 sq.ft., 2001 MOBILE HOME to be moved. $55,000
* Large Residential lots in Cross Plains in the Tom Bryant Addition. Trees. Prime Home Building Location. 
$6,500.00
* 3BD/1B, landscaped, metal roof, water well, large trees, large lot, paved street, in Cross Plains. $48,000
* Beautiful, large, residential lots. Lots of trees, great location.
* 3BD/2B frame, pier & beam, on paved street in Rising Star, lots of large Pecan trees, recent improvements. 
REDUCED $35,000
* 2BD/2B, BriGk£^ral H/A, large 2 car detached garage with storage, large Oak and Pecan trees, in Rising 
Star. REDU<™feT500.
* large residential lot in the Tom Bryant addition to Cross Plains, trees, prime home building location. 
INCOME PROPERTY;
NEW LISTING—IBD/IB frame home with 2 efficiency apartments, 2 1 car garages, all electric, 2 lots, large 
trees, in Cross Plains, $750/mo income. $60,000. Owner Agent.
COMMERCIAL;
* Commercial Building, 1,800 sq.ft., CH/A, on West Hwy 36, great condition, great location! $42,000
* 30 X 30 SHOP BUILDING, 2-10 X 12 roll up doors, one 10 X14 roll up door, and one walk in door, one 
50 X 140 lot with 9X12 office bldg., concrete floor, (auto-lift negotiable) in Cross Plains, $25,000.

FOR MORE LISTINGS GO TO: www.crossplains.com

> -L a s t year, Guidant recalled 109,000 detibrillators because of defects that could 
lead to serious injury and death. Guidant failed to inform doctors or patients for 
three years that some of their defibrillators had a defect that caused the devices 
to short-circuit. The Guidant Defibrillator Recall includes the following models of 
cardiac defibrillators: Prizm 2 DR, Contak Renewal, Contak Renewal 2, Ventak 
Prizm AVT, Vitality AVT, Renewal 3 AVT and Renewal 4 AVT.

Ferrer. Poirot

Licensed in Texas and Okiaiidma, may 
associate counsei in other Jurisdictions

If you received one of these devices 
and are concerned about the possible health risks, 
contact Ferrer, Poirot & Wansbrough today. 

1- 800- 521-4492
24 Hours a Day /  7 Days a Week

I f  you are not sure which model you have, o r i f  you  have other questions regarding your device, you should consult with your physician.

TRACTOR & FARM
EQUIPMENT a  SERVICE IS OUR BUSINESS

W. Mwy,6, Deldfon

CLARK

TRACTOR &  SUPPLY. INC.

■ A d v e r t i s e m e n t

A Gold Mine in Bedroom Drawers
Newswire: People are selling their old 
scrap gold that is gathering dust for 
its cash value because gold prices 
are so high. With the price of gold at a 
25 year high (over $650.(X) per ounce), 
it makes sense. ScrapGold.com, a 
gold recycler, offers free insured 
recycle kits so people may cash in their 
scrap with 24 hour service and 
guarantee satisfaction. Th^ accept

broken and outdated items like 
chains, charms, rings and more. 
"Everyone has bits of gold just lying 
around which can be turned into cash" 
says Richard Zakroff, VP of 
marketing. "Even old dental gold has 
value." ScrapGold.com processes 
over 10,000 recycle Kits per month. 
People can get a free GoldKit 
at 1-800-283-4700 or ScrapOold.com.

WHEN RENEWING 
YOUR

SUBSCRIPTION TO 
THE

CROSS PLAINS 
REVIEW

PLEASE BRING THE 
RENEWAL CARD SENT 
TO YOU IN THE MAIL 

THANK YOU

TEXAS STATEWIDE CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING NETWORK

M

a
a
aM

TexSCAN Week of 
October 15, 2006

BUSINESS
OPPORTUNITIES

A L L  C A S H  C A N D Y  R o u te . 
Do you ea rn  $800  in  a day? 
Y our own lo ca l can d y  ro u te . 
30 m achines and candy. A ll for 
$9,995. 1-888-625-5481, M ulti 
Vend, LLC.
V E N D IN G  R O U T E : Snacks, 
drinks, energy d rinks too! A ll 
b rands, all sizes. P rofessiona l 
equ ipm ent support. F inancing  
w ith $7500 down. VPAN, Inc. 
1-877-843-8726, Local.
$ 7 5 0 -$ 2 0 0 ,0 0 0  F R E E  C A SH
G ra n ts  2 0 0 6 ! N e v e r  re p a y !  
P e rs o n a l/M e d ic a l b il ls ,  New 
B usinesses /H om es, School. No 
c re d it check  re q u ire d . 1-888- 
8 9 6 -4 3 7 4  E x t . 4 3 4 3 , G ra n t 
R eso u rces. Fee req u ire d .

DRIVERS
CD L-A  D R IV E R S : Expanding 
F le e t o ffe r in g  R eg io n al/O T R  
ru n s . O u ts tan d in g  pay p a ck ­
age, exce llen t benefits , gener­
ous hom etim e, lease purchase 
on ‘07 P e te r b i l t s .  N a tio n a l 
C a r r ie r s ,  1 -8 8 8 -7 0 7 -7 7 2 9 , 
w w w .nationalcarriers.com
DRIVER CDL TRAINING with 
$0 down, financing  by Central 
R efrigerated. Drive for Central 
and earn up to $40k plus first 
year! 1-800-727-5865, Ext. 4314. 
www.centraldrivingjobs.net.

DRIVER - COVENANT TRANS- 
PORT has opportunities for CDL-A 
drivers in your area! No matter what 
your experience level is, we have what 
you’re loddng for. Now hiring Students, 
Solos, Teams, Lease Purchase and O/Os. 
CaU today. 1-866-684-2519. EOR
D R IV E R S BE IN D EM AND!
D e b a te d  and regional oppor­
tunities. CDL training available, 
no <|redit check, top trainee pay 
and full tuition  reim bursem ent. 
1 -8 8 8 -7 1 2 -4 0 9 2 . w w w .S w ift 
TruckingJobs.com .
DRIVERS - CDL-A True lease to 
own program. Low payments/short 
term lease. High revenue freight. 
100% Fuel Surcharge. No Hazmat. 
No forced dispatch. FFE, 1-888- 
864-0012.

D R IV E R S  - $ 5 ,0 0 0  S IG N -
O N  fo r  e x p e r ie n c e d !  G u a r­
an teed  in co m e  fo r f irs t year. 
E x am p le ; 1 yr. OTR & drive 
1 2 0 ,0 0 0  m ile s  = $ 4 4 ,3 0 0 .0 0  
G U A R A N T E E D . C a l l  F F E , 
1 -800-569-9232.

F E D  E X  G R O U N D . 0 / 0
T eam s. A v e rag e  50 0 0  m ile s  
w eek . 1 .2 4 9  h u b  fu e l ,  s ta r t  
0 .96 . CD L-A  w ith  1 yr. ex p e ­
rience . A sk about our new tem ­
pora ry  ra te . 1-866-832-6339 .
0 / 0  D R IV E R . T he FTS 
is  h ig h e r  h e re !  Z e ro  dow n 
le a s e / lo w  p a y m e n ts .  $ 1 .1 1  
av erag e . $ 2 ,0 0 0  P ro d u c tiv ity  
Bonus. $2 ,600 R eferra l Bonus. 
B ase  P la te  p ro v id e d .  F F E , 
1-800-569-9298.
TEAM S NEEDED: Run South 
this w inter. C lass A-CDL with 
H azm at. Top pay & b en efits . 
1-800-428-0678, Press option 1. 
www.Armellini.com

EVENTS
W O R L D ’S L A R G E S T  G UN 
SH O W  - O c to b e r  21 & 22 - 
T u lsa , OK F a irg ro u n d s. S a tu r­
day 8-6, Sunday 8-4. W anenm- 
ache r P ro d u c tio n s . M eet “The 
V irg in ian ,” Jam es D rury. Free 
a p p ra isa ls . B ring  yo u r guns! 
w w w .tu lsaarm sshow .com

HELP WANTED
FOREMEN TO LEAD utiUty field 
crews. Outdoor physical work, many 
entry-level positions, paid training, 
$17/hr. plus performance bonuses 
after promotion, living allowance 
when traveling, company truck and 
benefits. Must have strong leadership 
skills, good driving history and be able 
to travel throughout Texas. E-mail 
resume to Recruiter25@osmose.com 
or fax 1-985-871-0605. 
www.OsmoseUtilities.com EOE 
M/F/D/V
S E R V IC E  T E C H N IC IA N S  
AND sales representative needed 
for growing John Deere & Bobcat 
dealership. Hunting, fishing, ski 
area, competitive salary, commis­
sions & benefits. Craig, Colorado. 
C all R aphael 1-970-824-6163, 
Fax 1 -970 -824-6344 , E -m ail; 
creuer@tri-stateequip.com

REAL ESTATE- 
LAND FOR SALE

EXAM PREP
“ P O S T A L  E X A M S ” . T he 
average po sta l em ployee earns 
$20 /hour s ta rtin g , average pay 
$57K /year. Inc lud ing  benefits  
& o v e rtim e .P a id  tra in in g  and 
v a c a t io n s .  N o e x p e r ie n c e  
n e e d e d . 1 -8 0 0 -5 8 4 -1 7 7 5 ,  
R ef#P 4701 .(N ot a ffilia ted  with 
the U SPS .) Fee requ ired .

FOR SALE
S A W M IL L S  F R O M  O N LY  
$2,990.00. Convert your logs to 
valuable lum ber w ith your own 
Norwood portable band sawmill. 
L og sk id d e rs  a lso  a v a ilab le , 
w w w .n o rw o o d industries .com . 
F ree  in fo r m a tio n ;  1 -8 0 0 - 
578-1363, Ext. 300-N. 
W O L F F  T A N N IN G  B E D S  
- B u y  d i r e c t  a n d  s a v e .  
F u ll  B o d y  u n i ts  f ro m  $22 a 
m o n th . F R E E  c o lo r  c a ta lo g .  
C a ll to d a y !  1 -8 0 0 -8 4 2 -1 3 0 5 , 
w w w .n p .e ts ta n .c o m

HOMES FOR SALE
H O M E  F IN A N C IN G  - G et
P re-A pproved  100% loans or 
sm all down, based  upon your 
circum stances. Perfect, Limited, 
T roubled  C redit (B ankrup tcy- 
O K ). C all M o rtg ag e  M akers  
1-512-292-4444 or 1-888-500- 
0000 (TMB#44749).

MISCELLANEOUS
AIRLINE M ECHANIC - Rapid 
training for high paying aviation career. 
FA A predicts severe shortage. Finan­
cial aid if qualify - job placement assis- 
tance. Call AIM 1-888-349-5387. 
ATTEND CO LLEG E O NLINE 
from home. M edical, Business, 
Paralegal, Computers, Criminal 
Justice. Job placement assistance. 
C om puter provided. F inancial 
aid if qualified. 1-866-858-2121, 
www.OnlineTidewaterTech.com

MOBILE HOMES 
FOR SALE

O W N ER  IN JA IL -M ake up 3
b ack  p ay m en ts  on m a n u fa c ­
tu red  hom e. C all fo r d e ta ils . 
M any extras. Call LUV Hom es, 
1-800-934-9644, RBI# 03190.
Z E R O  DOW N IF  YOU own 
your land. Build your own home! 
Karstin, Clayton, LUV Homes- 
Tape and Texture m odels. We 
finance. LUV Homes, 1-800-934- 
9644, RBI# 03190.

A B A R G A IN  - 75 A cres - 
$ 3 9 ,9 0 0 . R o llin g  h ills , good 
brush, rock outcroppings. Trophy 
d eer h a b ita t .  G ood h ig h w ay  
access. Easy terms. Perfect for 
hunting re trea t. Texas Land & 
Ranches, 1-877-542-6642.

M A STER  PLANNED O CEAN 
FRONT Community, homes starting 
mid-$300K, Gulf front lots $595K, on 
beautiful Mustang Island, near Cotpus 
Christi, www.cinnamonshore.com, 
1-866-551-0347.
H A M A K U A  C O A S T , i l g  
Is land  H aw aii, 21 acre ocean 
view pasture 7 m iles N orth of 
Hilo, $750,000. Other lots avail­
able 1 -850 -231-5119 / Danny. 
O w n er f in a n c in g  av a ilab le . 
www.cplandco.com

R A N C H  L IQ U ID A T IO N  100
A cres. R educed p rice. P erfect 
fo r h u n tin g  re tre a t. B ig buck 
area, plus turkey, dove, quail and 
more. Very private w/EZ highway 
access. $49 ,900  w /financ ing . 
Texas Land & Ranches, 1-866- 
899-5263.
S T E A L  M Y L A N D . 2 acres  
w ith  p r iv a te  b o a t dock  on 
44,752 acre lake. Central water, 
paved streets, electricity. Steal it 
today, $44,900. Call Texas Land 
& Lakes, 1-888-773-5253 
T E R R E L L  C O U N T Y ,
3 2 8 + a c re s  a t $ 2 9 5 /a c re ,  
fe n c e  l in e ,  f la t la n d ,  w h ite - 
ta il. 417-t acres at $225 /acre , 
c o rn e r  tra c t ,  c an y o n s , m ule  
deer, ow ner financed . 1-830- 
8 8 5 -4 5 7 8 .  w w w .ra n c h e n te r  
p risesltd .co m

54.28 A C R E S, SO U T H W E ST  
o f R o ck sp rin g s , end o f road , 
earthen tank, whitetail, exotics, 
hogs, turkey, $925/acre, owner 
term s. 1-800-876-9720. www. 
ranchenterprisesltd.com.

Run Your Ad In TexSCAN!
Statewide A d.........................$450

299 Newspapers, 1 MUlion+ Circulatioo
North Region Only.............. $195100 Newspapers, 320314 C ircu latioD
South Region O nly.............. $195

99 Newspapers, 4 4 9 3 ^  Circulation
West Region Only................ $195

100 Newspapers, 246,648 Circulation

To Order: Call This Newspaper 
direct, or call Texas Press Service 

at 1-800-749-4793 Today!

ueoa

Toll Free: (877) 805-5550
Coleman, Texas 76834 

wwwJiveoak-reaiforsxom

CHARI J^CHESSHIR
8 « O K E R / O W N e f i

(325) 625-4181
RESIDENTIAL & LAKE PROPERTY

308 N. Ave D - Handyman special on 2 l o 6 0 f e ^  TLC but is a great deal at only______________
316 N. Ave D - Small home with hardwood l8 0 L ® > v e  & refrigerator convey. Lots of Potential__
316 Ave C - Nice brick 2BR-1B home to be finished on large corner lot_______________________
1202 W. 13th, Cisco - 3BR-2B handicap access, Nice older home, fenced back yd., storage Bid.. 
1704 Ave N, Cisco-3BR-2B, residential/commercial possibilites on 1.44 Ac., 1-20 access R d .___

13,000 
.18,000  
.39,900  
39,900 
77,500 

. 78,000400 NW 5th St. -3 or 4BR-2B beautiful Victorian home, 1.75 Ac., Hardwood floors, Lg oak trees__

Lake Brownwood Lot - Beautiful homesite in gated community, short walk to lake__________ ONLY__4,900
417 Lakeview, Lake Coleman- Beautiful 4BR-3B manufactured home, 7 lots with 1 lot on'iak'e______ 112,500

HOME WITH ACREAGE
5.5 Ac.- Adorable 2BR-2B updated cottage with tall ceilings, lg. oaks, pecan & fruit trees.
8.6 Ac. - 3BR-1B cottage, covered w/ live oaks, 2 water wells, hunting area_____________
18.5 Ac.- 3BR-1B quaint farm house on paved road with good underground water__________
20 +/- Ac - Hwy frontage, pond w/bass & catfish, new home started not completed, great buy. 
20 Ac & New Home - Nice small acreage, seasonal creek, trees. Cross Cut, pick your colors. 
27.2 Ac.- 2BR-2B Secluded c o u rU y M P iE R )ts 0 0 M T < R A O i^ e '', 1 tank, beautiful view s_

HUNTING & RECREATIONAL PROPERTY
54 Ac.-Great hunting, thick cover, 2 small food plots, nice 3/2 MH for home or hunting cabin.
87 Ac.-Near Lake Leon, abundant deer, turkey, dove, & quail, excellent water well_________
110 Ac. - Beautiful, very remote, with rolling hills covered with oakss. Great hunting_______
179AC.-2 ponds, excellent grasses, good cover, deer, turkey, quail, dove, hogs. County water. 
268 Ac. - Premium property, 2 tanks, exc. Deer hunting, rugged, hilly terrain, oaks, cedar etc._ 
338 Ac.- 4 tanks, excellent hunting and fishing, rolling hills, Liveoak pasture, stock pens______

_129,000 
J  02,000 
-9 9 ,5 0 0  
_  70,000 
. 100,000 
136,500

• 169,900 
-180,000 
-231,000 
290,875 

-778,800 
776,812

_92,000
COMMERCIAL

301 SW 3rd - Excellent mechanic shop or commercial building. Office space, rest room, parking.

Buying or Selling
Let Our Team “PUT YOUR NEEDS FIRST”

Your FIRST Call for Personal Professional Service
Erlene Barker 325-625-2876 Jerry Bodine 325-665-4724
Karen Lenz 254-725-4023 Charles Chesshir 254-725-7119

CALLAHAN REALTY
Rodger Hart -GRI, Broker 
Tom Ames, Agent

254/725-7189 office 
254/725-6375 home

325/669-3335, cell 
325/668-4157, cell

ACREAGE WITH HOME:
NEW LISTING—3BR/2B, DW, on 95 acres N of Rowden. Heavy brush, excellent hunting, well, 
septic tank. Very secluded, but easy access. $190,000
NEW LISTING—Cisco-entire city block with 3BR/2B brick home. CH/CA, fenced yard with 
covered patio. Ideal business location on Hwy 183 three blocks N of 1-20. $139,000 
HOUSES:
NEW LISTING—2BR/1B, Steel siding. Metal roof, carport. Very low maintenance. Some 
remodeling done, water heater recently replaced. Large pecan trees. Good area. $49,900.

HAVE QUALIFIED BUYERS NEED MORE LISTINGS 
Check all our listings at callahanrealty.net.
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301 SW 3rd
Excellent Mechanic Shop or Commercial Bldg. 

Priced to sell at $92,000

Call CHARLES at Liveoak 325-625-4181
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2006

T A

TEXAS PRESS 
ASSOCIATION

m CH

NOTICE: While most advertisers arc reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We urge readers to use caution and when in doubL contact 
the Texas Attorney General at 1-800-621-0508 or the Federal Trade Commission at 1-877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bizop

Extend your advertising reach with TexSCAN, your Statewide Classified Ad Network.

(USPS 138-660) is 
published weekly on 
Thursday, for $26.00 per 
year within Callahan 
County; $31.00 per year 
elsewhere in Texas; $34.00 
per year out of state. (No 
foreign copies except APO 
o r like Address); by 
Review Publishing Co., 
116 S.E. 1st St., Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443.

Periodical postage  
p a id  at C ross  
Plains, Texas 76443

POSTMASTER: Send 
address changes to 
Cross Plains Review, 
P.O. Box 519, Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443. 
Telephone: I (254) 725-6III 
FAX: 1 (254) 725-7225

n  'TOMMY MAC CONNBU.Y. Agent'
325.625.4544 HOME

Jody Guthrie, Broker

325.625.4544 HOME 
325.370.5081 CELL 

raechandhuntingland.com

Have Buyers Need Listings
Check All O f Our Listings At Our Website

GREAT OPPORTUNITY to own 85 
acres approximately 15 miles 
East of Abilene. Heavy Oak trees 
and brush on property affords 
excellent Deer and Turkey 
Hunting. 4 rural water meters. 
Perfect place to build your dream 
home or great wee4tend retreat. 
Nice 2 bedroom, 2 bath, modular 
home with huge carport & more. 
More information available. Call 
Jack at (325)854-2501.

325-854-2501
"A J>iadUm OJ Semiice.

A ‘Reputatim Tofi Reouttd."

mailto:rlestate@crossplains.com
http://www.crossplains.com
http://www.crossplains.com
http://www.nationalcarriers.com
http://www.centraldrivingjobs.net
http://www.Swift
http://www.Armellini.com
http://www.tulsaarmsshow.com
mailto:Recruiter25@osmose.com
http://www.OsmoseUtilities.com
mailto:creuer@tri-stateequip.com
http://www.norwoodindustries.com
http://www.np.etstan.com
http://www.OnlineTidewaterTech.com
http://www.cinnamonshore.com
http://www.cplandco.com
http://www.ranchenter
http://www.ftc.gov/bizop


Barb's Cues
By Barbara  Holmes W o r c e s te r

Years ago an Alabama grand­
mother gave the new bride the 
following recipe.

This is an exact copy as written 
and found in an old scrapbook - 
with spelling errors and all.

WASHING CLOTHES
Build fire in backyard to heat 

kettle of rain water. Set tubs so 
smoke wont blow in eyes if wind 
is pert. Shave one hole cake of 
lie soap in boilin water.

Sort things, make 3 piles
1 pile white,
1 pile colored,
1 pile work britches and rags.

To make starch, stir flour in 
cool water to smooth, then thin 
down with boiling water. Take 
white things, rub dirty spots on 
board, scrub hard, and boil, then 
rub colored don’t boil just wrench 
and starch. Take things out of 
kettle with broom stick handle, 
then wrench, and starch. Hang 
old rags on fence. Spread tea 
towels on grass. Pore wrench 
water in flower bed. Scrub porch

with hot soapy water. Turn tubs 
upside down. Go put on clean 
dress, smooth hair with hair 
combs. Brew cup of tea, sit and 
rock a spell and count your bless­
ings.

Paste this over your washer 
and dryer. Next time when you 
think things are bleak, read it 
again, kiss that washing ma­
chine and dryer, and give thanks. 
First thing each morning you 
should run and hug your washer 
and dryer, also yourtoilet—those 
two-holers used to get mighty 
cold!

One of my prized possessions 
is a painting of my great grand­
parents The great grandma has 
a revolver in her apron pocket. 
This was for real. In those days 
a woman did not go to the out 
door facilities or the wood pile 
without her gun. When people 
ask what the gun was for 1 say 
“Snakes” either walking or crawl­
ing. Word has it that she could 
use that pistol.

BHW

Texas Style Diabetes Workshop
The Twelfth Annual Diabetes 

Texas Style Workshop is set for 
Saturday, November 4, 2006 in 
the Shelton Building, 2000 Pine 
Street, Hendrick Medical Center 
in Abilene.

Registration and exhibits open 
at 8:00 a.m. and the workshop 
concludes at 11:45 a.m. Ses­
sions and speakers include - 
“Taking Control” by Paula 
Jernigan, an AlC Champion and 
“These Feet ARE Made for Walk­
ing” by Charlotte Allen, RN, BC, 
CWOCN with Hendrick Medical 
Center.

Exhibits will include diabetic 
supplies, patient educational 
materials, and pharmaceuticals 
with company representatives 
to answer questions. Breaks will 
feature diabetic foods and reci­
pes.

BI-RITE AUTO
4 B LO C K S E. O F  LIG H T-C R O SS PLAINS- 

F H O N E  254-725-7361 
Closed F riday  & Sunday

CASH SPECIALS GOOD THRU OCT 2006
01 F150,Auto, O.D., rencent over haul on 4.6 V8, Looks.Runs good.......... $3 ,5 0 0
95  Plymouth Voyger, 7Pass, V6, Looks,Runs good (Green).............. $ 995
9 4  F 2 5 0  TXirbo Diesel Super Cab, 5spd, cold air, runs good...... $ 3 ,4 0 0
96  Chev Ext Cab, V8, Auto, cold air, Looks,Runs good (W hite)...$ l,895  
99  Ford Taurus,3,0 V6, cold air. Looks,Runs very good (W hite)..$3,195

9-DIESEL TRUCKS
97  F 25 0  S u p er  Cab P o w er  Stroke,5spd,coid air,iooks,mns good....$6,250  
9 6  Chevy Diesel Ext, Cab 3500,Auto, A super nice good truck...$4,850
9 3  Dodge Ext Cab Cummins Diesel,Auto, iTon, A super nice truck$4,895
95  F 350  P o w er  S troke Diesel,5spd,cold air, steal flat bed, dual rears.$5,550
96 F 2 5 0  Power Stroke,Auto, Cold Air, Super Cab, runs very good..$5,250
94  F 3 5 0  C rew  C ab  P o w er  Stroke,Auto, cold air. Runs good (White).$4,250 
9 4  F 250  T lirb o  D iese l S u p er  Cab,5spd, Looks,Runs good, cold air$3,950
94 F250 T brbo Diesel Super Cab,Sspd, Runs good, cold air.......$3,650
91 E350 Van,7.3 Diesel, Auto,runs good, cold air, ONLY............. $1,900

VANS & SUV’S
01 F o rd  E x p lo rer  Sport,V6,Leather seats,Fully loaded,Looks (R ed)...$5 ,950  
9 9  F ord  E x p lo rer  Sport,V 6, Loaded, Looks,Runs very good (Red).$5,450 
98F ord  E xp lorer  Sport,V6,cold air,looks,runs very good,cIean inside/out .$5 ,250  
94  F ord  E x p lo rer  E d d y  Bauer,V 6, cold air,runs good (White)__..$3 ,450
94  F o rd  Explorer,4D R , V6, Auto, Runs good, 4x4 (White)................$ 3 ,250
97  Isuzu R odeo,4cyl, Auto, cold air, looks, runs good (Green).......... $2 ,850
9 9  Ford Windstar,V6, Auto, cold air, 7Pass, looks,runs good (Burgandy)...$4,950
9 6  F ord  Windstar,3.0 V6,recent motor overhaul,cold air,Looks,Runs good$2,995

9 7  AerOStar 7PaSS,V6, Auto, cold air, Looks,Runs very good (Lt. Blue)......$ 2 ,750
95 Chev Cargo Van, 350 V8, Auto, Runs good (White)............. .......$1,495
97  P ly m o u th  Voyger,V6,7Pass,cold air,Looks,Runs good....SpeciaI...$2,495 
9 5P lym ou th  Voyger,V6,coldair,7Pass,Looks,Runsgood(Green).Special.$l,495 
95  Pontiac Transport,V6, Auto, Looks,drives good, 7Pass ...S p ecia l.$ l,495  
95  D o d ge Grand Caravan,V6, cold air, looks,mns good (Red).Special.$ 1,595
90  D od ge C on version  Van,Nice interior. Rear seat/bed, cold air..Special.$ 1,695
88  C h evy  Suburband^ual Air, nice inside/out, runs good..... Special $ 1,250
91 Ford E 350 ITon Window Van, 7.3 Diesel, Auto, O.D.good van....$  1,900

AUTOMOBILES
99  Mercury Sable,V6, cold air. Auto, Looks,runs good (Red)............$3 ,195
2 0 0 0  Ford Contour,4DR,4cyi,coidair,(Red)was $ 3 ,4 5 0 ..... now......... $3 ,250
99 Mercury Tracer,4cyl, 4DR, looks, runs super nice. Auto (White).........$2,650
99  Taurus,V6, Auto, Cold air, looks, runs good.......Special..................$3 ,350
97 Ford Taurus, V6, cold air, looks,runs good (Lt. Blue).....................$2 ,750
9 6  Ford Taurus,V6, cold air, looks,runs good (White).Special...........$1 ,950
96  Buick Century,V6, over 30 M.P.G., low miies..This Week Only.......$1 ,995
97 Xhunderbird,4.6 V6, cold air, clean inside & out, runs good.Special....$2,650
97 Lincoln Mark VIII, LSC, fully loaded, sun roof, looks,runs good.......$2,950
96 Mercury Cougar XR7,3.8 V6, Rear wheel drive. Runs good..... $2,450
95  Pont. Bonoeville,V6, runs good, cold air, local car...Special........ $1 ,495

91 Lincoln Continental, 91 Ford Crown Victoria,

GAS TRUCKS-ETC
01 F 150  XLT,4DR, Super Cab,V8, Auto, cold air, clean in & out....$5,750  
01 F 150  LWB Reg Cab, 4.6 V8, Auto, Looks,Runs good...Special....$3,790
01  Ford Ranger Super Cab,V6, Auto, 4DR, Looks,Runs very good ..$5 ,950  
9 7  F 2 5 0  Crew Cab,V8, Auto, 4DR, Super nice Truck (W hite).Special.$3 ,750  
9 6  Dodge Dakota 4x4,V6, Auto, cold air, very good condition .Special$2 ,650

96  Dodge Dakota,4Cyl, 5spd, runs good, roll bar...... Sp ecia l..........$2 ,595
96  Chevy Ext Cab,V8, Auto, looks,runs good (W h ite)...S pecia l...$  1,950  
93  Chev 4x4 Ext Cab,V8, Auto, Everything works, runs good ..... $2 ,8 5 0
2 Car Hauling Trailer, In good condition................................... $3,250
84 Wrecker F250 Super Cab,4x4...............................................$2,250
84 Chev 2500,350 V8, Auto, cold air, runs very good, good t ir e s ..$ l ,295

WE BUY-SELL-TRADE & FINANCE 
NO FINANCE CHARGE 1ST 6 MONTHS 

OPEN MON, TUES, WED, THURS. & SAT. 9 AM-6 PM 
CLOSED FRIDAYS & SUNDAYS

Phone 254-725-7361 or Cell 325-669-0999

2006-2007 KIWANIS OFFICERS—Vice-President-Rick TerreU 
(from left). President Elect-Jim Senkel, President-Lajeana 
Long, and IVeasurer-Don Clark. Officers not available for photo 
were Secretary-Kathy Chesshir and Immediate Past President- 
David Estes. Board of Directors are Dale Bishop, W.G. McCoy, 
Ronnie White, Bob Pipes, and Susan Schaefer.

Down Home-

The workshop is free to the 
public, but participants are asked 
to register by calling Martha Alice 
Spraberry, Jones County Ex­
tension Agent  - FCS, at 
(325)823-2432 by Thursday, 
November 2nd.

All programs and information 
of Texas Cooperative Extension 
are available to everyone with­
out regard to race, color, sex, 
religion, age, handicap or na­
tional origin. The Texas Coop­
erative Extension agency will 
seek to provide reasonable ac­
commodations for all persons 
with disabilities for this meeting. 
They request that you contact 
Judy Gully, Taylor County Ex­
tension Agent-FCS, at 672-6048 
as soon as possible to advise us 
of the auxiliary aid or service 
that you will require.

for example, that blind people 
end up developing other senses to 
a much higher level than those 
who have their sight.

Most people rely on sight above 
all. So try using your other senses. 
For example, you can get dressed 
with your eyes closed. Or learn to 
distinguish different house keys 
by touch.

Then you can "lose" your other 
senses. Turn off the sound on the 
TV, and try to follow the plot. 
Taste foods while holding your 
nose. This forces you to use 
different neural pathways to 
experience the food.

3. Make small changes. Even 
minor changes in your routine 
activate the cortex and 
hippocampus (a part of the brain 
crucial for memory formation) 
to create new neural pathways.

If you always watch TV from 
the same chair—switch. Try
rearranging the furniture, or 
reorganizing your desk. Take a 
different route to work.

Or, simply do the same 
things—but in a different order. 
Eat breakfast for dinner and 
dinner for breakfast. Travel 
around the grocery store in the 
opposite direction.

4. Take up a challenging 
hobby. Devote yourself to a new 
pastime that calls for complex 
skills. Artistic pursuits, for 
example, activate nonverbal and 
emotional centers in the cortex. 
You can try learning a musical 
instrument, or studying a foreign 
language, or taking up 
photography.

5. Become more social.
Interacting with other people is 
the best single brain exercise. It 
brings all the senses into play, 
forces you to think quickly, and 
hones your speaking skills.
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SATURDAY - OCT. 28. 2006 -10  AM
ROCKY ASH AUCTION BUILDING 

1309 SOUTH ACCESS ROAD - CLYDE, TEXAS
WE ARP SH iiM fi 4 JOINT ESTATESI

PARTIAL LISTING: 
New Table w/4 Chairs 
2 Queensize sets with 

springs & mattresses 
Recliner
Hammond Organ 
Craftsman motorized 

Grinder & Sander 
Power Tools 
Garden Tools 
Construction Tools 
Microwave 
Wagner Power 

Plus Painter 
VCRs
Pump Organ 
Glassware 
Kitchen Items 
Household Items 
L-Shaped

Computer Table

Queensized Bed 
Occasional Tables 
3 Large Entertainment 

Centers 
Sony Stereo 
Small Craftsman Lathe 

with Lots of Extras 
Craftsman Motorized 

Jig Saw 
Love Seats
Electronic Components 
& Electronic Testers 
Chain Saw 
Satellite Equipment 
Handmade Chairs 
Old Bottles
Used Aluminum Windows 
Lots of Miscellaneous 
Items too numerous to list!

No B uyers Fee a t O u r Sales 
All announcem ents m ade a t sale tim e supercede 

any w ritten  o r o ra l advertisem ent.

ASH AUCTION  
ENTERPRISERocky Ash 

TXS6684  
(325) 668-7107 
(325) 893-5663

Andy Ash 
TXS 9628 

(325) 675-0381

Happy Birthday

Social contact is also important 
for psychological health. People 
with good social networks have 
fewer physical and psychological 
problems as they age.

Seek out social interactions of 
every sort. For example, tele­
phone a friend. Or make small 
talk with the supermarket clerk. 
Or go to the bank teller instead of 
the ATM.

Also, strive for more ambitious 
interactions. Arrange social 
gatherings that involve a variety 
of brain-boosting strategies. Join 
a book club, host a wine-tasting 
party, or arrange a weekly game 
of poker, bridge or Monopoly— 
anything that involves complex 
thought and social contact.

East Ways to Do Hard 
Things

*Best Way to Find Contact 
Lens Lost in Carpet: Simply 
place a nylon stocking over the 
nozzle of a vacuum cleaner and 
carefully vacuum the area. The 
lens will be pulled onto the 
stocking.

♦Avoid H am m ering Your  
F ingers: To get small nails 
started, hold the nails between the 
teeth of a hair comb. For large 
nails, grasp the nail with needle- 
nose pliers.

Remove Scratches from 
Furniture: Rub on some 
toothpaste! Its mild abrasive 
action is effective for minor 
scratches. When you're done 
repairing the scratch, wax with 
furniture polish and buff with a 
clean cloth.

Get Rid of Tomato Sauce 
Stains in Plastic Containers:
Rub with a damp cloth dipped in 
baking soda. It costs pennies and 
works like magic!

OCTOBER 21 OCTOBER 25
Kimberly (Hedrick) Jackson Kathleen Gregg

John Harrigal Jim Brown
Chas Ray Thornhill W.C. Perry
Mrs. Cecil Wilson Carl Thomas

Arvel Mitchell Clint Freeman
Connie (Stout) Tillery Jody Long Henderson

Donna Michelle Beeler John Ray Purdue
Nadine Nickerson Magen Shoemaker

OCTOBER 22
Cindy French
Stanley Honea OCTOBER 26

Brenda De-Ann Teague Rachelle (Bishop) Norris
Mrs. Reuben McCowen Rodney Free

Rodney Mac Jones Travis Bailey
Bob Morgan Lynn Koenig
Leslie Cox Eddie Koenig

Cassie (Gallaway) Sliger Latricia Chandler
Steven Jack Homer David Goble 

John Larkin
OCTOBER 23 Ricky Burks
Hugo Mauricio Joyce Klutts

Vic Curry Gene Thornhill
Ella Ruthie Roberts Dick Grider

Janet Shults Mrs. Louise Strickland
Barbara (Strength) Thomson 

Marilyn Marie Murray 
Jay Jackson

Wendy (Phillips) Key OCTOBER 27
Suzi Gray

OCTOBER 24 Morgan J. Robertson
Jerry Hinkle Glen McNutt
Bobby Davis Chris Ray Connelly

Larry Don DeBusk Eddy Glen Wyatt
Monty Joe Garrett III Lanny Kellar

Larry Spivey Walter Pope
George Roady Randall Thornton
Edith Beggs Melissa (Pancake) Richards

Jackson Logan Worsham Brock Walker

1 Large 1 Topping j 
$6.00 plus tax I

Coupon expires 10-30-06 I

Located inside Skinny’s

(254) 725-7161

TUESDAY s p e c ia l ! 
2 Large 1 Topping j

$10.00 plus tax I
Coupon expires 10-30-00 |

Plus Checkout O ur >
Daily Specials !

A g F a b r i c a t i o n  

J a s o n  B i e n

Custom Welding * Gates * Signs * Metal Fabrication & Hog Traps 
CNC Table

N. Hwy 206 (Across From County Show Bam)
Shop: 254-725-4554 Cell: 325-829-3715

BROADBAND
INTERNET

N O W  AVAILABLE!
WesTex Connect 

has been providing 
Broadband Internet in Clyde 

for 5 years.

500 Chestnut Abilene
325-673-1930

Gentle Family

r m r f T i
Accepting New Patients 

Joe K. Reed, DOS 
Over 30 years experience 

In Baird Accepts

CHIPS
& Most Dental Insurance
1-866-854-1173 * 325-854-1173


