
Weather
HIGH LOW

March 10 66 29
March 9 51 29
March 8 43 32
March 7 59 29
Precipitation to date .56".
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N e w  D r i v e r ’s L i c e n s e s  
A n a t o m i c a l  G i f t  C l a u s e

All drivers licenses issued after 
January 1. 1976, will contain a 
statement whereby the holder of 
the license may designate any 
part of his body as an anatomi­
cal gift at the time of his death.

Major C.W. Bell, commanding 
Region 5 of the Texas Depart­
ment of Public Safety which 
issues the drivers licenses, said 
the 64th Legislature enacted the 
measure that became effective 
the first of the year.

Accordingly, all drivers licens­
es issued after January 1. will 
contain the statement which 
specifies any or all of the

donor's body tliat may be used 
as an anatomical gift.

If a person does not desire to 
participate in the anatomical gift 
program. Bell said, he need not 
do anything regarding comple­
tion of the statement. Drivers 
license will continue to be 
laminated on the front but the 
back will not be laminated in 
order that holders of the licens­

es may sign the statement.
The anatomical gift statement 

will be printed on the reverse 
side of the donor’s operator's, 
commercial operator's or chauf­
feur's license. The gift is invalid 
on expiration, cancellation, re­
vocation or suspension of the 
license or by lining out that 
portion of the statement.
Cont. on Page 3, Col, 5.

V
Plans  U n d e r w a y  For

J u n i o r  Lives tock  Show

REX DOCKERY

Alhle les  
Honored 
O n  F r i d a y

All high school boy and girl 
athletes will be honored during 
the annual Muleshoe High 
School Athletic Banquet which 
will be held March 12, at 7:30 
p.m. at the High School Cafe­
teria. It is sponsored by the 
Booster Club.
Rex Dockery, an assistant 

coach from Texas Tech Univer­
sity in Lubbock, will be guest 
speaker for the event. George 
Washington will be master of 
ceremonies.

Dockery is a 1965 graduate of 
the University of Tennessee and 
a native of Cleveland. Tennes­
see. He played high school 
football at Bradley Central High 
School before signing with Ten­
nessee. Following his football 
career, he served as a graduate 
assistant at his alma mater in 
1964-65. He then moved into 
high school football coaching at 
Harrintan (Tennessee) High 
School and at Morristown East 
(Tennessee) High.

His four-year record as a head 
Continued on Page 4, Col. 6

Final plans and arrangements 
are being made for this year's 
Southwest Junior Livestock 
Show according to Johnny Bob 
Carruth the Chairman of the

Pol ice
Report

Ihe police docket from the 
local law inforcement center 
shows that on February 23, 
Felix Reyes of Gum and Hous­
ton reported stolen from his 
farm two and a half miles west 
of the airport, on the Plainview 
Highway, a toolbox containing 
assorted tools valued up to S200. 
Also, two batteries, and one 
rear tractor wheel weight.

Another incident happening on 
February 23 was a gun stolen 
from a car belonging to Dr. John 
David Hamblen, of 121 W. 
Avenue B.
Mrs. Roses, of 418 West 

Avenue E reported a breakin. A 
pair of glasses, blankets and 
pillows were missing.
On February 29, Gary Pierce of 

Combination Motors, reported 
stolen two radios and a tape- 
player.

Finis Kimbrough of 1805 Ave­
nue C reported stolen from his 
garage, fishing equipment.

Superintendent Neil Dillman 
reported vandalism on March 2 
at Mary DcShazo School. Win­
dows and lights were apparently 
shot out with a B.B. Gun.

Mrs. Bill Brown of La/buddie 
reported a theft of a man's shirt. 
John Fried reported on March 

2. two hot shots and one electric 
Continued on Page 4, Col. 6

Chamber of Commerce’s South­
west Junior Livestock Show 
Committee.
Carruth said that the activity 

pace is picking up as time nears 
for this 43 Annual Show. The 
Show will be held from March 
14 through March 17 at the 
Panhandle South Plains Fair 
Grounds. The Show will again 
be kicked-off with the selection 
of the Show princesses which 
will be held in the Fair Park

Bailey Y oung  
D emocrats  
Organize

On Wednesday night, March 
3, a group of young Bailey 
County residents met at the 
Muleshoe State Bank Communi­
ty Room to organize the Young 
Democrats of Bailey County.

Mike Smiddy. a member of the 
Young Democrats of Texas Tech 
and regional coordinator for this 
area of the Young Democrats of 
Texas, brought the meeting to 
order and provided the guide­
lines for organizing the group. 
Along with Smiddy were several 
other members of the Texas 
Tech organization. Attorney. 
Gordon “ Corky" Green of 
Muleshoe was also in atten­
dance. Green was instrumental 
in spurring the idea of Young 
Democrats in this area.
A Constitution for the organi­

zation was adopted and signed 
by the members present, who 
were Bill Durham. Randall 
Hamilton. Tom Crow. Mike 
Cont. on Page 5, Col 6

Coliseum at 2:30 p.m. on March 
14.
New events scheduled for this 

year’s show will be a Farm and 
Ranch Implement Display that 
will run for the duration of the
Show.
This year's "cornbread and 

beans" buyers lunch will start 
at noon in the Merchants Build­
ing and will cost only 50 cents 
per plate.

Immediately prior to the sale of 
the champion animals will be a 
presentation of the memorial 
plaque t< the family of the late 
Roy Furr to whom this year’s 
Show is being dedicated. All 
judging events are open to the 
public and everyone is invited to 
attend. Some of the best ani­
mals in the nation will be 
entered by youngsters for the 
Texas and New 'Mexico coun­
ties in the South Plains area.

All animals must be in barn by 
2:00 p.m.

LAMB DIVISION - must be 
ear tagged and weighed by 6:00 
p.m. Weighing begins at 1:00 
p.m.
STEER DIVISION - must be 

ear tagged and weighed by 6:00 
p.m. Weighing begins at 1:00 
p.m.

PRINCESS CONTEST - 2:30 
p.m. - Fair Park Coliseum.

Mondav, March 15, 1976
BARROW DIVISION -- bar- 

rows will be weighed and sifted 
beginning at 8:00 a.m.

LAMB DIVISION -  will be 
judged in the east end of the 
Horse Show Pavilion beginning 
at 9:00 a.m. according to class 
numbers.
STEER DIVISION -- will be 

judged in the west end of the
Cont. on Page 3, Col 6

T h e  D a n g e r o u s  W e e d

Whal  The Pr a c t i c i ng  Ph 
Should K n ow About  Mar

Editor's Note: This is the third 
in a four-part scries dealing with 
the harmful effects of smoking 
marijuana. In this article. Dr. 
Hardin B. Jones, professor of 
medical physics and physiology 
at the University of California, 
Berkeley, and assistant director 
of the Donncr Laboratory, dis­
cusses What the Practicing Phy­
sician Should Know About Mar­
ijuana. Today's article concerns 
the individuals sensitivity to the 
drug and the strength of Ihe 
marijuana used.

For some persons, smoking the 
weed once or twice a week mav

constitute heavy use as judged 
by its effects. It depends on the 
individual sensitivity to the drug 
and the strength of the marijua­
na used. Certainly all daily 
smoking of marijuana is heavy 
sue and there arc many signs of 
chronic debilitation. It is com­
mon to find that daily users have 
become unable to cope with 
ordinary problems. An early 
sign of such effect is the 
complaint that he being “ has­
sled" by almost any interper­
sonal contact, an indication that 
the mental reserves are thin. 
Daily marijuana users, though

heavily affected, have no insight 
into their condition or recogni­
tion of what has happened to 
them.

A morphological causative fac­
tor for their mental state has 
been observed. In ten consecu­
tive cases of young men who 
were heavy users, the late Dr. 
Ian Campbell, professor of radi­
ology at the University of Lon­
don. and his associates, did air 
electroencephalography and 
found enlargement of the ventri­
cles and rounding of the usually 
sharp and well defined edges of 
the ventricles • findings that

Final Hospital Plans 
Awaiting Approval

Final plans have gone to 
Austin this week for contruction 
of a new wing and renovation of 
the present hospital facility in 
the City of Muleshoe. Marshall 
Cook, hospital administrator of 
West Plains Medical Center 
here said it will probably take a 
couple of weeks before they are 
approved and then the Hospital 
Board will have to advertise for 
bids 30 days prior to letting the 
bid and construction begin on 
the new hospital.

Brasher-Joyette and Papier, 
architectural firm in Lubbock 
have been working on the plans

for several months ow and it is 
hoped that construction will be 
underway in the very near 
future.

"We had hoped we could start 
earlier, but things just take 
more time than we had antici­
pated." explained the hospital 
administrator.
Over a year ago, it looked like 

the City of Muleshoe would 
loose their hospital and there 
was a dire need for more 
doctors. A group of local citizens 
got together and formed a 
committee and started raising 
funds in an effort to keep the

hospital and build a new facility. 
They also solicited more doctors 
for the community.

Besides needing funds to con­
struct a new facility, the hospital 
Cont. on Page 6, Col 5

School  B o a rd  
Hires  Teachers

Members of the Muleshoe 
Independent School District 
Board of Trustees met Monday 
night until the wee hours of 
Tuesday morning, hearing re­
ports, going over the hiring of 
school personnel and holding 
two open hearings as requested

City MusicBai ley Oi l , Gas 
Reserves  Dr a ined^,û en,s

l o  StateCrude oil and natural gas 
reserves in the Bailey County 
area arc being wontonly drained 
by the East coast non-producing 
states under present federal 
regulations, Texas Railroad 
Commission candidate Terence 
L. O'Rourke said today.

"The East coast states want 
our oil, they want our gas and 
for some reason, they feel they 
are entitled to this state's 
natural resources at a low price 
and without taking the risks to 
develop their own,” O'Rourke

Hospital
Schedules
Seminar
SAN ANTONIO - Recent ad­

vances in the treatment of 
"pseudogout" will be included 
in "Arthritis Update", the ther­
apeutics seminar for health 
professionals scheduled for 
Thursday, March 11. at West 
Plains Medical Hospital in 
Muleshoe.
Pseudogout is one of the nearly 

100 different forms of arthritis. 
The seminar will originate 

from The University of Texas 
Health Science Center at San 
Antonio at 12:30 p.m. CST and 
will be received locally by 
means of a live two-way com­
munications hookup with the 
C ont. on Page 6, Col 4

Moisture 
Falls In A rea

The two-day rainy weather, 
with snow freezing rain and 
light snow, left Muleshoe and 
the surrounding area with a sum 
of .26 of an inch for the week. A 
total of .56 of an inch of 
precipitation was reported from 
the month of January to the 
date.

Several people in the area 
receiving moisture of some kind 
were O.E. Duncan. 13 miles 
south and three miles east of 
Muleshoe. He received .2 of 
rainfall.

Mrs. Ed O'Hair reported snow 
covering the ground, but not 
any rain was received.

Mrs. Runyan Brown, who lives 
three and a half miles on the 
West Camp Highway reported 
.10 of an inch of moisture.
The Raleigh Masons received 

.3 of an inch.
Mrs. Harland Lindell received 

.3 of an inch of rainfall. They 
have 90 acres irrigated wheat 
and are watering it for the 
second time now. They have 
cattle grazing on it. also.

ys i c i an  
ij u a n a

point to severe atrophy of the 
deepest portion of the cerebral 
hemispheres. It is noteworthy 
that the pleasure centers arc 
also in this area of the brain. 
Clinical findings on heavy mari­
juana users points to the devel­
opment of organic brain disease 
as described by Kolansky and 
Moore. It appears that irrever­
sible brain changes may be 
encountered as marijuana use 
extends beyond three years. 
Kolansky and Moore note that 
marked and rapid improvement 
resulting from abstinence docs 
Cont. on Page 3, Col 4

Adam Rodriguez, a student at 
Three-Way High School and son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Rodriguez 
of Maple, won second place in 
the oratory competition and a 
$25 scholarship to South Plains 
College in Levelland. Texas, 
during the recent Tejano Day 76
ceremonies at SPC.• * * * •

The West Camp community 
Family Night will be held Satur­
day night. March 13. at 7:30 
p.m. in the Beck Gin Store 
building.

Refreshments of cake and cof­
fee will be served. Everyone is 
urged to come and attend the 
monthlv social at West Camp.

said.
"Estimates of proved reserves 

of crude oil and natural gas in 
Texas are dangerously declin­
ing. and if this state turns into 
another Appalachia from taking 
care of the rest of the country, 
the East coast states will still be 
draining Texas for more under 
present federal programs." he 
added.
O'Rourke, a Houston attorney 

and former Texas assistant at­
torney general, pointed out that 
this county is in District 8A of 
the Texas Railroad Commis­
sion's oil and gas division. 
Estimated proved natural gas 
reserves in this district were at 
their peak in 1966 with 3.769, 
843 million cubic feet. By 1974, 
those reserves had declined 49 
percent to 1,953,860 million 
Continued on Page 4. Col. 7

The Muleshoe Music Teach­
ers’ Association held its Student 
Affiliate competition Sunday, 
March 7 to select the winners 
which will go to the state 
convention in June and play in 
the ten-piano ensemble "Texas 
Composer" program. The num­
ber selected by the Muleshoe 
Association is "A Comedian" 
written by Alfred Teltschik of 
Houston. If is a piano-duo which 
is written for Piano 1 and Piano 
II. which means that five pupils 
were selected to play each part.
The Judge for the contest was 

Ferrell Roberts of Clovis, New 
Mexico who is a well-known 
teacher of the area. The compe­
tition was held at the home of 
Elaine Damron, local Student 
Affiliate chairman. Teachers 
Coat, oo Page 3, Col. 7.

by staff members.
During the financial report, is 

was learned that total net in­
come from the 1975-76 basket­
-ball fund was $3,014.25 while 
football brought in $8,640.30, 
making a total income from both 
programs amounting to $11,662. 
55.
The Board approved payment 

of current bills and heard the 
current tax collection report 
showing 90.38 percent of the 
current taxes have been col­
lected.

A report on progress made 
Cont. on Page 3, Col 1

Carpenter  
Vies For 
Princess

Miss Joie Carpenter. 18. repre­
senting the Progress 4-H Club, 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmie T. Carpenter of Mule­
shoe, is among 40 young ladies 
competing for the title of 4-H 
Princess and FFA Princess of 
the Southwest Junior Livestock 
Show.
The contestants, all from the 

South Plains area, will compete 
Sunday, March 14, in the Coli­
seum of the Panhandle South 
Continued an Page 4, Col. 7
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CHAMPION HAMPSHIRE BARROW . . . Jimmy Lee Gleason and his dad. Dr. Jerry Gleason of
Muleshoe pose with Jimmy's champion Hampshire Barrow at the Houston Livestock Show and Rodeo. 
The barrow, weighing 242 pounds took first place in the heavy weight division and was bred by Jimmy 
Seaton at Lazbuddie using a sow owned by Jimmy Gleason.
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"III SHERRIF" . . .  Jimmy Lev Gleason, son of Dr. and Mrs. Jerry Gleason of Muleshoe placed first with
hisChiunina steer at the Houston Livestock Show and Rodeo recently. The 1044 pound steer was named 
"Hi Mierrif" because he was bred by Bailev County Sherrif Dee Clements. He placed first in Ihe light 
weight division. Pictured with Jimmy and his parents is Bailev County Extension Agent. Spencer 
I nnkslex (I).
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Drouth  Increases  D e m a n d  For Credi t
Even with the easing of infla­

tion from the very rapid rates of 
a year ago. the prices farmers 
and ranchers must pay for 
inputs to production still in­
creased an average of six per­
cent last year.
This increase over the past 

year pushed the price of agricul­
tural inputs nearly two-thirds 
higher than in 1970. And as 
efforts have been made to 
expand production, costs actual­
ly rose even more.
Now. with costs high and still 

rising, drouth has restricted 
grazing in some areas and 
caused crops to be replanted, 
bringing a further increase in 
the cash requirements of produ­
cers.
To cover their higher operating 

costs, farmers and ranchers in 
Texas are turning more to their 
banks for credit. That is the 
consensus of bankers active in 
agricultural loans.
Demand for agricultural loans

has been increasing for six 
months. And although loan 
repayments are sluggish in 
some areas, the survey, con­
ducted by the Federal Reserve 
Bank of Dallas, indicates ample 
funds are available to farmers 
and ranchers in most areas, 
provided they can meet equity 
requirements.

Nearly half the bankers sur­
veyed. in fact, reported they 
were actively seeking farm loan 
accounts. Very few thought 
funds were short enough to 
cause a good loan to be refused. 
But nearly all were limiting their 
loans to borrowers that were 
well qualified.

Operating Loans
Demand is strongest in the big 

crop-growing areas — South 
Texas, the Panhandle, the Roll­
ing Plains of North Texas, and 
along the Gulf Coast. By com­
parison. demand is generally 
weak in ranching areas.

With most of the state havinii

had little rain since summer, 
there is far less forage than 
usual. Effects on loan demand 
from stockmen vary somewhat, 
however, from area to area.

In some parts of the state, such 
as around Amarillo, lack of 
forage has sharply curtailed 
demand for loans to buy cattle 
for grazing wheat and oat fields. 
In others, such as around San 
Angelo, there has been a sharp 
increase in borrowing to buy 
supplemental feed for range 
cattle.
Overall, however, demand for 

cattle loans is weaker than 
demand for crop loans. And the 
difference could become more 
pronounced.

Without a break in the drouth 
soon, growers in the South 
Plains, the Rio Grande Valley, 
and along the upper Gulf Coast 
will have to begin irrigating 
more than usual.

Ixian Repayments
Overall, repayment of loans

has not been holding up as well 
as usual. While lack of moisture 
and loss of income has given 
some crop farmers problems 
meeting their notes, most of the 
slowing in repayments has been 
due to conditions in cattle 
markets.
Plagued for two years with 

depressed prices for feeder and 
stoeker cattle, cow-calf opera­
tors have been badly hit. And 
with rising costs and limited 
moisture, many have had 
trouble repaying their loans, 
having to fall back on renewals 
and extensions.
Crop loan extensions have also 

been fairly numerous, however. 
This results partly from a strate 
gy some growers use in market­
ing their crops.
To protect themselves against 

sharp drops in commodity prices 
at harvest time, these farmers 
are spreading the sale of their 
crops out over several months. 
While they may forego the best

price, by settling for an average 
price, they avoid selling out at 
the lowest price.
Some of the increase in crop 

loan extensions, then, result not 
so much from reduced profits as 
dclavcd profit taking.

To delay sale of their crops, 
most farmers must have the 
support of their banks. Many 
banks, however, are apparently 
willing to extend crop loans if 
growers believe this will give 
them a better chance in the 
market.

Epp er I v Rites Held

Friona Industr ies  
Declares  Dividend
FRIONA -• The board of direc­

tors of Friona Industries. Inc., 
has declared a cash dividen of 5 
cents per share on its common 
stock. The dividend is payable 
May 3, 1976 to shareholders of 
record as of April 16. 1976. The 
board will give consideration to 
future quarterly dividends 
based on the Company's finan­
cial performance.
This is the first cash dividend 

the Company has declared since 
its stock was initially offered to 
the public in October, 1973.
For the first six months of its 

fiscal year ended December 31,

Funeral services were held at 3 
p.m. Monday. March 3. for Otis 
E. Epperly. 65, of Bovina. The 
services were held in the Trinity 
Baptist Church of Muleshoe 
with Rev. Derrell Lewis, pastor 
of the First Baptist Church of 
Bovina officiating. Rev. David 
Evetts. pastor of the Muleshoe 
church assisted. Burial was in 
the Bailey County Memorial

1975. the Company reported net 
income of $771,762, or 62 cents 
per share, on revenues of $25.2 
million.
Friona Industries is engaged in 

agri-business enterprises, in­
cluding the manufacture and 
sale of commercial cattle feeds, 
retail sale of animal health 
supplies, custom cattle feeding 
and sale of Company-owned 
cattle.

*  * *  *

Silence is an underplay­
ed virtue.

OTIS E. EPPERLY

Prices good thru March 13. 1976. 
We reserve the right to limit quan­
tities. None sold to dealers.

All Flavors

Hi-C
Drinks

32 OZ. BOTTLE

Coca Cola

Piggly Wiggly For

Park under the direction of 
Singlcton-Ellis Funeral Home.
Epperly died Saturday at 6 

a.m. in the Parmer County 
Community Hospital in Friona.

He had lived in Bovina for the 
past five months, moving there 
from Muleshoe. He was a 
carpenter and a member of the 
Methodist Church.
He was born January 20, 1911 

in Hinton. Oklahoma and mar­
ried Ola Pesch October 4, 1975
in Bovina.
Survivors include his wife; a 

son. Dwight of Wellington. Cali­
fornia; two daughters, Mrs. 
Claudia Kent of Amarillo and 
Mrs. Mary Douglas of Hereford; 
his mother, Mrs. Millie Epperly 
of Muleshoe; three sisters. Mrs. 
Millie Mae Ellis of Sumner, 
Washington. Mrs. Marie Chap­
pell of Lockhart and Mrs. Clara 
Hilliard of Clovis. New Mexico; 
a brother. Roy of Tacoma, 
Washington; II grandchildren 
and one great grandchild.

QUALITY &  VALUE

For Whiter Whites

Piggly Wiggly 
Bleach

Carol Ann

Salad
Dressing

k r i s p y

Sunshine

Krispy
Crackers

Piggly Wiggly, Grade A

Fresh
Eggs

Limit

Please Plus Deposit
->UbP

■GARDEN FRE5M PRODUCE

Washington Fancy Red

Delicious
Apples Lbs.

Sweet Western

D ’ a n j o u  P e a r s
Crisp Green

B r o c c o l i  S p e a r s
Romaine, Red or Green, Endive 
or Boston

Leaf Lettuce
Creamy

Fuerte Avocados

Lb.

Lb.

Each

Ea

1/2-Gal.|

Superb Valu-Trim

Chuck
Steak

Lean & Meaty

Short Ribs

FROZE N  FOOD

Macaroni & Beef. Macaroni & Cheese. 
Spaghetti/Sauce or Chicken & Noodles

Morton Dinners
1 1 -OZ.
Pkgs.

Piggly Wiggly. Corn. Cauliflower Broccoli
or Green Peas n  fin
Frozen Vegetables 3  S1 00
P elR M  2 per Pack Oin. -  $ 1  00

P i e  S h e l l s  *
" " el”  9  6 ., $100

0  Cans »Grape Juice

Superb Valu-Trim

Round Steak
Superb Valu-Trim

S irlo in  Steak
Superb Valu-Trim

T -B o n e  Steak
Full Cut. Superb Valu-Trim Boneless

Round Steak
Superb Valu-Trim

Club Steak
Superb Valu-Trim

Cube Steak
_______________  Smoked

Hot Links
“Mix or Match" Piggly Wiggly Halves or 
Sliced Peaches, Choice Pear Halves or 
Choice

Fru it 
Cocktail
Piggly Wiggly. Choice

Whole 
Tomatoes
Piggly Wigghr Assorted 1 Ply

Qt.
Jar

1-Lb.
Box Doz.

Superb Valu-Trim  
Seven Bone

Shoulder
Superb Valu-Trim

Rib
Fresh

Ground
Roast Steak Reef

98c . 98* .69*
u .  5 9 ‘

Lean Boneless

S te w in g  Beef j r
, 9 8 c

Oscar Mayer

Sliced Bologna 12-0z $129
PKg 1

*  9 8 c
Oscar Mayer

Sliced  Bologna t s  8 9 c
$149

Lb. 1

Oscar Mayer

B raunschw eiger 8 oz 7QC
Tube I  J

$119
Lb. 1

Whole

Smoked P icnics u .  9 9 c
$139

Lb. 1

Farmer Jones

Pork Sausage M b. $139
Pkg. 1

$159
Lb. *

Hormel Link Sausage

Little S izz le rs « - * 1 «  
Pkg ■

Lb

Piggly Wiggly. Fancy Cut

Green
Beans
Piggly Wiggly, Fancy Whole Kernel cr 
Cream Style

Golden
Corn

nggiy Wiggly Assorted
Paper Tow els
Piggly Wi|«ly, Assorted. 2 Ply, 37 5 Sheet

Bath Tissue
2 145 Ct 

Rolls

4 Roll 
Ph*

Piggly Wiggly, Assorted

Facial Tissue
Piggly Wigglv. Assorted

Paper Napkins
2 200-Ct. I Q '  

Boxes I  U

4 9 '180 Ct 
Pkg

Swift's Cornish

Game Hens [35
20 oz.

Lb. Avg.

1 Turkeys Lb. |6 9 '
Circle T

Corny Dogs
Mrs. Paul’s

Buttered Fish Fillets
Mrs. Paul's, IS Sticks

Fish Sticks
Borden's Lite Line

Cheese S lices
Piggly Wiggly, Halfmoon

Longhorn Cheese
Kraft's

10-Ct.
Pkg.

10-oz.
Pkg

14-oz.
Pkg.

189
129 
139
143

8 9 ‘
39Single  Sliced Cheese 12ek°;

FRESM  OAIRV“l

I r V

Piggly Wiggly

Ice Cream
Vj-Gal.
Ctn.

Piltsbury's, All Varieties

Egg Baskets
Piggly Wigglv. Regular Quarters

Fresh M argarine
P'ggly Wiggly

Butterm ilk

4 $1 oo
■ Cans I

316 oz $ 1  00
Pkgs. I

■•s 6 9 c

m



School...
Cont. from Page 1 
toward completing the Market 
Value Report on taxable proper­
ty that the Governors Commit­
tee is requesting through the 
Texas Education Agency, was 
made by J.M. Brown, Tax 
■Assessor Collector.

An estimated budget for the 
City and School Tax offices for 
the remaining five months of the 
Current Fiscal Year was ap­
proved. Salaries amount to $10. 
900, with $28 going to Work­
men's Compensation Insurance, 
making the total $10,928.
Five hundred dollars is allowed 

for audit. $100 for vehicle 
maintenance; $250 for building 
upkeep; $100 for other equip­
ment and repair and $160 for the 
postage machine, totaling $1, 
210.
Supplies and materials for 

office use totaled $250.
Travel expenses alloted a- 

mounts to $350. with $50 going 
for fees and dues and $30 for 
other operating expenses, mak­
ing a total of $430.
Furniture and equipment ex­

penses amount to $200 while 
vehicles amounts to $3,000, 
making a total of $3,200 and a 
grand total for the remaining 
five months. $16,018.
The Trustees discussed and 

studied assessed tax values for 
the next tax year, and approved 
changing from 45 percent of 
appraised values to the full 
appraised value. This was ne­
cessary, according to Superin­
tendent Neil Dillman, because 
the School District is on the 
maximum maintenance fund 
rate this year. This is a result of 
recent State Legislation and 
inflation.

An open hearing as requested 
by Fred Mardis, high school 
principal, for personal reasons. 
The board heard and discussed 
allegations that were revealed 
about Mardis' character. The 
board then gave Mardis a vote 
of confidence and cleared him of 
any charges, allegations and or 
rumors.

Another open hearing for Bob 
Graves concerning the coaching 
of Girls Basketball w as held and 
Graves answered questions the 
board had concerning his coach­
ing methods.
Graves was then re-employed 

by the board to be head girls 
basketball coach for the 1976-77 
season.
The organization and assign­

ment of personnel for the girls 
basketball program will be 
worked out at a later date with 
the new athletic director.
New State Textbook Adoptions 

w ere approved for 1976*77. The 
titles were taken from a list 
approved by the State Board of 
Education and recommended by 
the Local Textbook Committee 
made up of teachers and admin­
istrators.
The local school board re­

viewed and approved a report 
requested and sent to the Assis­
tant Attorney General, Civil 
Rights Divison. Department of 
Justice. Washington. D.C. This 
is to meet the Federal Regula­
tions of the Voting Rights Act of 
1965.
The following information was 

submitted as requested; "The 
written material a voter will see 
relative to the election will be 
translated into Spanish. The 
bilingual forms to be used by 
Mulcshoe Independent School

District are printed by Hartgra- 
phics. Inc.. Austin. Texas, and 
are to be submitted to the 
Secretary of Slate. Austin. Tex­
as for approval by the U.S. 
Department of Justice.

"Bilingual translators have 
been used for the past several 
years to assist with School 
Trustees Elections. Bilingual 
translators will be provided this 
year for absentee voting and on 
election day.

"Prior to the School Trustee 
Election. April 5. 1975. the 
polling place was designated 
and election held in the Mule- 
shoe Junior High School Libra­
ry. By official action of the 
Board of Trustees of the Mule- 
shoe Independent School Dis­
trict on January 13. 1975. the 
polling place was changed and 
election was held in the Mule- 
shoe High School Cafeteria. 

"The Cafeteria is directly a- 
cross the street from the Mule- 
shoe Junior High Library, has 
more floor space, a larger 
parking area and is more con­
venient for voters. The Board of 
Trustees, by official action. 
January 12. 1976, designated 
the Muleshoe High School Cafe­
teria as the polling place for the 
School Board Election to be held 
April 3, 1976."
An invitation to School Board 

Members to attend the Annual 
Regional School Board Work­
shop to be held at Texas Tech 
University. April 21. 1976 at I 
p.m. until 5 p.m. was read. This 
is sponsored by the Texas 
Association of School Boards. 
The Board of Trustees rccind- 

ed the present Student Mar­
riage Policy in order to meet the 
Federal Regulations of Title IX 
Civil Rights Act Amendment of 
1972.
The Trustees took no action on 

the latest information received, 
regarding State School Board 
Action on Attorney General 
Hill's opinion H-702 on school 
fees.
The current enrollment report 

as compared to last year on 
corresponding dates is as fol­
lows: Senior High, 1974-75 was 
503 with 471 during 1975-76. a 
difference of minus 31; Junior 
High. 443 and 440. a difference 
of minus three; Mary DeShazo 
Elementary. 423 and 428, show­
ing five more in attendence this 
year; Richland Hills Primary, 
409 and 386, a difference of 
minus 23 and Special education. 
34 and 26, a difference of minus 
eight. Total enrollment for 1974- 
75 was 1812, while in 1975-76 it 
was 1751, a difference of minus 
61.

The Board reviewed the Board 
Election dates and on March 8. 
1976 held a drawing for places 
on the ballot. W. Jim Young will 
have the first position on the 
ballot, followed by Charles Lew­
is D.D.S.. H.D. Hunter. Jr., and 
Don Harmon.

March 15. 1976 is the first day 
to vote by absentee ballot at the 
County Clerk's office and March 
30. 1976 is the last day to vote 
absentee. April 3. 1976 begin­
ning at 8 a.m. until 7 p.m. at the 
High School Cafeteria is election 
day.

A report on the vandalism at 
Mary DeShazo Elementary 
School on March 2 was heard. 
Fourteen windows and three 
outside lights and globes were 
apparently shot out with some 
type of gun.
The resignation of Mrs. Nellie 

Rannals. fifth grade teacher at 
Mary DeShazo Elementary 
School was accepted, effective

at the end of the current school 
year, for personal reasons.
The following teachers and 

secretaries for the 1976-77 
school year were re-employed: 

Editor's Note: Names with an 
asterisk have been approved for 
employment, but the contract 
cannot be issued until Federal 
Funds are funded.

HIGH SCHOOL FACULTY! 
Bill Bickel. Vo-Ag; Gail Biz/cll, 
Biology; Elizabeth Black. Art; 
Esther Marie Dillman. Library; 
Cheryl Gist. English; Marcus 
Gist. Driver Education; Wanda 
Gramling. Homemaking; Dorine 
Harbin. Homemaking; Betty 
Jennings. Algebra I and II; 
James Jennings. History; Ruby 
Lee Kerry. English; Nickie Lan­
ders. Math and Rodney Mur­
phy, Government and Driver 
Education (Contract withheld 
until he can work with new 
Athlete Director this spring.).
Dona Naismith, English and 

Spanish; Whonda Pummill, 
Health and Physical Education; 
Eric Smith. Chemistry and Sci­
ence; Lucy Faye Smith. English 
and Business; Tom Smith, 
Math; Eva Dean Stephens, 
Homemaking; Keith Taylor, In­
dustrial Art; George Washing­
ton, Physical Education and PC; 
Betty Murray. Secretary; Wal­
ter Shain, Auto Mechanics; 
•Judy Hindelang. English Re­
medial.
JUNIOR HIGH SCHOOL

FACULTY: Martha Anthis, 
Band; Dorothy Beddingfield. 
Social Studies and English; 
JoAnne Bray, Special Educa­
tion; Randy Crock, Physical 
Education and Math (Contract 
withheld until he can work with 
new Athletic Director this 
spring.); Sharyn Flowers, 
Health and Physical Education; 
•David Gray, title  1 Math; Pat 
Gunter. Science; *Kathy Kram­
er. Title 1 Reading; David Lynn. 
Science and Physical Education 
(Contract withheld until he can 
work with new Athletic Director 
this spring.); ‘ Linda Marr, Read 
7; LaVonnc McKillip. Librarian; 
Barbara Milburn, Reading; 
Dean Minor, C and SC; Jean 
Moore, Art; Evelyn Northcutt, 
Math; Ruth Page. Social Studies 
and English; Georgia Pena, 
Title I Math;

Maria Esther Perez. Social 
Studies and Spanish; Mike Rich­
ardson, Math; R.D. Rogers. 
Social Studies; Mary Scoggin, 
Science; *Brenda Scott, English 
and Art; Aileen Siewert, En­
glish; ‘ Margaret Teaff, Title I 
Reading (Math); Pat Watson. 
Reading and Spanish; Janie 
Hughes, Secretary; Ronnie 
Jones. Physical Education and 
Assistant Principal; Bette Cow­
an. Secretary Curriculum Of­
fice: Pauletta Crawford. Payroll 
Clerk; Jo Addine Mayhugh. 
Bookkeeper; Elizabeth Ed­
wards, Secretary to Superinten­
dent.

MARY DESHAZO ELEMEN­
TARY FACULTY: Peggy Bur­
nett. Third grade; Owetha Fin­
ley. Third grade; Barbara Fin­
ney, Third grade; Bobby Gro­
gan, Third grade: Edith Hen­
derson, Third grade: Janet 
Schroeder. Third grade; Priscil­
la Bickel. Title I Math Third and 
Fourth; Ethel Allison. Title I 
Math and Math (bilingual); 
•Suzanne Murphy, Title I Read­
ing and Reading; Linda Clines. 
F’ourth grade; Joyeline Costen, 
Fourth grade; Pauline Guinn. 
Fourth grade; Letha Patterson. 
Fourth grade; Jane Rudd. 
Fourth grade; ‘ Beth Skipworth, 
Fourth grade; Loyce Killings-

worth. Fifth grade; W.B. Slay- 
den. Fifth grade; Wilma Smith. 
Fifth grade; Patsy Warren, Fifth 
grade; Eva Rogers. Title 1 Math; 
Ellen Glover. Librarian: Jose­
phine Mitchell. Music: ‘ Shirley 
Williams, Special Education; 
•Nita Burreson, Math and 
Reading Title I Regular; Imo- 
gene Tiller. Nurse; Mary Janice 
Brantley. Secretary.
RICHLAND HILLS PRIMARY 

FACULTY: Virginia Bowers. 
Kindergarten; Linda Jones, 
Kindergarten, ‘ Dianne Bock, 
Kindergarten; Floree Peaugh, 
Kindergarten; Norma Prather, 
Kindergarten; Wendelyn Allen, 
First grade; Helen Bryant. First 
grade; Mary Helen Gutierrez, 
First grade bilingual; Ruby 
Lambert, First grade; Mary B. 
Obenhaus. First grade; Mildred 
Tanner. First grade; Katherine 
Sanders, Title I Math and 
Language; Billie Carlyle. Se­
cond grade; Rose Mary De La 
Certa. Second grade bilingual; 
Estelle Fox, Second grade; Elsie 
Kendall. Second grade; Eloise 
Wilson. Second grade; Mabel 
Wolfe. Second grade; Lou Edna 
Willoughby, Title I Reading 
First and Second Oral Lan­
guage; Mary Mardis. Librarian; 
Jo Jinks, Special Education; 
Beulah Mimms, Title I Reading 
Second Oral Language; Betty Jo 
Davis, Nurse; Ella Dunbar. 
Secretarv.

What...
Cont. from Eage 1 
not begin until several weeks 
have elapsed and then only if 
exposure has been of less than 
about three years' duration. The 
subjects of the Campbell study 
had all used marijuana for three 
years or longer. I have observed 
improvement in all college stu­
dents who. after established 
regular use, have cooperated 
with me in abstaining for sever­
al months. Most of them have 
become convinced by their per­
sonal experience of recovery 
that marijuana had indeed im­
paired their minds, and they 
have continued to abstain. Im­
proved memory, clearer think­
ing ability, feeling good, and the 
return or augmentation of sexu­
al functions have usually been 
noted in may series of cases. In 
three cases of students who 
were heavily affected, but not 
incapacitated. I had opportunity 
to follow them closely over a 
period of four years. In each, 
improvement was evident in a 
few months. These young men 
probably gained full recovery 
and lost all signs of suppressed 
mental functions. Viewed over 
the entire period of observation, 
the improvement was very slow 
and required a period of three' 
years.

Sunday's edition of the Bailey 
County Journal will conclude 
the four-part series and deals 
with the brain changes of the 
average marijuana user.
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New...
Coat, from P aje l 

Bell added that another me­
thod of voiding or cancelling the 
statement would be to secure a 
duplicate drivers license in 
which case the reverse side of 
the permit would be left blank.

For the gift provision of the 
license to be valid, the state­
ment must be executed each 
time the iccnse is replaced, 
reinstated or renewed. The do­
cument must be signed by the 
donor in the presence of witnes­
ses who must sign the document 
in the donor's presence.

License which are currently 
valid in Texas will not be 
replaced with the newly-desig­
nated one. but as holders renew 
their licenses, they will receive 
the license which contains the 
gift statement.

If currently licensed drivers 
desire the newly-designated 
one. they may contact their 
nearest DPS drivers license 
office and apply for a duplicate 
license for which there is a 
minimal charge.
The law that was enacted by 

the Legislature only requires the 
DPS to provide a space on the 
license for the statement con­
cerning the availability of the 
anatomical gift. "W e do not 
maintain records regarding the 
anatomical gifts." Bell added.

Recipients of gifts of bodies or 
vital organis may be any hospi­
tal. surgeon or physician, for 
medical or dental education, 
research, advancements of me­
dical or dental science, therapy

or transplantation; or any ac­
credited medical or dental 
school, college or university for 
cdcucation. research, advance­
ment of medical or dental 
science or therapy.
Other recipients may include 

any vital organ storage facility 
established for medical or den­
tal education, research, ad­
vancement or medical or dental 
education, research advance­
ment of medical or dental 
science, therapy or transplanta­
tion; or any individual specified 
by a licensed physician for 
therapy or transplantation need­
ed bv him.
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Former California Gov-Cily...

Plans...
Cont. from Page 1
Horse Show Pavilion beginning
at 1:00 p.m. according to class
numbers.

Tuesday, March 16, 1976 
BARROW DIVISION - will be 

judged beginning at 8:00 a.m. 
according to class numbers.

Wednesdas, March 17, 1976 
PREMIUM AUCTION -- Be­

ginning at 1:00 p.m. in the 
Horse Show Pavilion. This will 
be limited to the number of 
animals placed or 12 '/: percent 
ot the entries in each division 
less No Show animals, whichev­
er is less. Only those animals in 
the Sheep and Steer division 
which have placed and received 
prize money are eligible for 
moving up in sale order. If 
application of the percentage 
rule results in a fraction, then 
such fraction will be considered 
one animal.

Cont. from Pige 1 
having pupils participating in 
the competition were Jean 
Craft, Becky Jones, Kathy Ja- 
hay and Elaine Damron.
Winners in the Piano I compe­

tition were the following: Sharia 
Henry. Cindy Hamblen. Sheila 
Jordan, Keva Roming and Bren­
da Clay. Alternates were Mi­
chelle Agee. Teena Landers, 
and Kyle Kelly.

Winners in the Piano II compe­
tition were the following: Jill 
Turner. Scott Campbell. Sherri 
Henry, Stacey Campbell. Merri 
Hausmann. Alternates were 
Marleca Cox, Jan Whitt. Leslie 
Cowan and Lori Leak.

Winners also have to pass the 
state theory test on their school 
grade level before they are 
allowed to play at the conven­
tion. The theory test was given 
February 15 to 45 students also 
in the home of Mrs. Damron. 
Grades have not been received 
as yet. Those making higher 
than a 90 receive a medal.
The convention will be held 

this year in Austin at the Villa 
Capri Inn June 12-16. Mrs. 
Damron also will serve as the 
assistant organ chairman for the 
state convention this year.

SON TO HELP
President Ford’s 23-year- 

old son, Jack, will work on 
his father’s  1976 presidential 
campaign. Hehas never work­
ed in any of h is father’s cam­
paigns before.

ernor Ronald Reagan, with­
out formally declaring his 
candidacy, has consented to 
formation of a citizen’s com­
mittee to promote him for the 
1976 Republican nomination 
for president.

YOU CAN OWN A 
WESTERN AUTO 

STORE IN:
Lone S t a r ,  

T e x a s
There is .in oppotiunil) available in 
ihe above towns foi a Western Auto 
Associate Store selling' hardware, 
sporting goods, automotive supplies, 
furniture, refrigerators, freezers, wash 
cis. televisions. ( H V  tadios. other 
electronics, etc
We will ti.im >ou. help install your 
store and provide counselling after 
you’ie open. Financing is available to 
qualified prospects. If yo iue interested 
in owning your own Western Auto 
Associate Store call this toll free 
number today.

800-820-7700 fcxt. 818
Or write:

K I Renfro V P . Western Auto 
2107 Grand A>e Kansas C ity, Mo M10H 
Be sure to provide >0111 phone number 
and complete address.

WESTERN AUTO
iWj
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Ladies size 8 to 18

Pre-Washed Denim
Jeans or Skirt 

$'

Royal Park* fashion denims 
Faded blue or peach or mint. 
Choose stitched crease style or 
corgo pocket model, olso back 
zipper, belted skirt. Sizes 8 to 
18.

L i m  r = . i n -

NOW The Pre-Washed LOOK
For the entire Family

Junior Sizes 
100% cotton

Jeans
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Wrangler's

Famous Wrangler® 
styling and quality 
100% cotton Sizes 
5 to 15.

SHOP
BankAmlricahq
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R E G I S T E R
TO VOTE

At The B a i l e y  County  C o u r th o u s e  Or 
F u r n i s h  A l l  I n f o r m a t i o n  R e q ue s ted  

On V o t e r  R e g i s t r a t i o n  Fo rm -S ign  I t -  
S ta m p  And M a i l  To :

J e a n  L o v e l a d y - T  ax A s s e s s o r  C o l l e c t o r
B a i l e y  C o u n t y  C o u r t h o u s e  

M u l e s h o e , Texas

SALE
L A D I E S

P R E W A S H E D  R E V E R S E  
S T I T C H E D  C O O R D I N A T E S

SK IR T  r e s .  * 1 8
JA C K E T  r e s .  * 1 9
PA N T S  r e s . * 1 6 & * 1 8

BUY 1 AT REGULAR 
PR IC E  & GET 1 OF 
EQUAL  VALUE  FOR 

JUST  1 PENNY MORE
T H U R  F R I  S A T
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M en's Pre-Washed Denim Jeans
Regular Values to $14. y . 6

Shown ore only a  few styles from our pre- _ _
woshed |eon collecfion You 'll save plenty T  5
if you shop now J  p T S .  L i  %

Dork blue or light 
blue, pure finish 
laundered denim 
Save 63c per yard, 
even more on 3 
yard purchase

45" Pre-Washed
Denim V

.76
2.39 value

l 7.6 yd
3 yd* $5.
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Boys’ and Girls’ Pre-Washed Jeans
won, hove been pre-woshed to achieve a soil ond worn 
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M iss Dutcher Feted 
With Bridal Shower

Y is
Miss Paulette Dutcher, bride- 

elect of Aurelio Cuevas. Jr. was 
feted with a bridal shower, at 
the Mulcshoe State Bank Com­
munity Room. March 5. at 7:30 
p.m.

Mrs. Heriberto Mcndo/a regis­
tered the guests.

Ib f

Miss Paulette Dutcher

Woe to hint that claims 
obedience when it is 
not due; woe to him that 
refuses when it is!

-Thomas Carlyle.

*  *  *  *

One good thing about 
summer is the welcome ar­
rival of fresh fruits and 
vegetables, especially  
those we have raised our­
selves.

O p e n  F o r  B u s i n e s s
"C O M PL E T E  LINE OF J UVENI LE 
F URNI TURE AND ACCESSORIES"

412 M itche ll

Ph.50J/762-65506 - 9 p m ,

BEEF BLANQUETTE
VA  lb, boneless beef for stew, 

cut in l  inch pieces 
fc c. flour
2 tsp. salt
1/8 tsp. pepper
3 T . lard or drippings 
1 bay leef
V.tsp. nutmeg 
17 small whole onions 
V4 c . water
1 package ( IS  ounces) fine 

noodles, cooked and well 
drained

3 T . melted butter or margarine 
1 can (4Vi ounces) whole 

mushrooms, drained 
K  c. sliced stuffed olives 
1 c. dairy sour cream

Combine flour, salt and pepper 
Dredge meat in seasoned flour. 
Brown in lard or drippings. Pour 
off drippings. Add bay leaf, 
nutmeg, onions and water. Cover 
tightly and cook slowly 2% hours 
or until meat is tender. Combine 
noodles and malted butter or 
margarine. Pack in a greased 
1 ’/4-quart ring mold. Place in a 
slow oven. (3 00 °F .) 10 to 15 
minutes. Discard bay leaf from 
b e e f  m i x t u r e .  Fo l d in 
mushrooms, olives and sour 
cream. Cook just until heated 
through Unmold noodle ring. 
Garnish with parsley and fill 
center of ring with meat mixture. 
6 servings.

The table was decorated with a 
candelabrum. The centerpiece 
w as done up in yellow daffodills, 
with the table covered with 
white lace over yellow .
A white cake, topped with 

yellow roses w as served by Mrs. 
John Purdy. Jr. and punch was 
served by Mrs. H.J. Leal, from 
silver and crystal appointments. 
Oneida silverware for 12 was 

given as a hostess gift. Hostess­
es for the occasion were Mrs. 
H.J. Leal. Mrs. John Purdy. Jr., 
Bernice Holdeman. Mrs. Heri­
berto Mendoza. Mrs. Norbcrto 
Gar/a. Mrs. Haney Poynor, 
Mrs. Charles Pummill and Mrs. 
Raynion Gonzales.

West Plains Hospital

Hospital Briefs
ADMISSIONS

March 6 - Sue Stovall and Lois 
Ethridge.

March 7 - Homer O. Long, 
C.C. Snitker, Ruth Colbert, 
Fileberta DeLeon and Dorothy 
Jones.

March 8 - Harland Reese. Mrs. 
Ira Smith and Ramon Gonzales. 
DISMISSALS

March 6 - Theresa Jones, 
Elvira Trevino, Goldie Dirikson, 
Lora Mears, Sue Stovall, Jack 
M. Baker, Lealand Dean. Ethel 
Julian, Elizabeth King. Hall 
Earl Rogers and Elvira Cruz and 
baby.

March 7 - Ynes Aleman. Mrs. 
Stockard and daughter, Anna 
Brown and Anna Hernandez. 
March 8 - Polly Birdsong, Fred 

Horn, Martha Williams, Mrs. 
Hugh Gore and Homer O. Long.

S a m u al  L a m a r
Mr. and Mrs. T.B. Spears of 

Texico are the proud parents of 
a new baby boy born March 8. 
1976, al 4:24 a.m. in the West 
Plains Memorial Hospital in 
Muleshoc. The baby weighed 
eight pounds, four ounces and 
was named Samuel Lamar. The 
couple has three other children.

Aleharo  Jose Cruz
Mr. and Mrs. Antonio Cruz, of 

Sudan are the proud parents of a 
new baby boy born March 5. 
1976. at 8:09 a.m. in the West 
Plains Memorial Hospital in 
Mulcshoe. The baby weighed 
seven pounds, ten and a half 
ounces and was named Aleharo 
Jose. He is the couple's first 
child.

Postal Problems
An old woman handed a 

stamped parcel to a post of­
fice clerk and asked him to 
weigh It. He told her that 
she had put too many stamps 
on it.

"Good heavens!" she ex­
claimed. ‘‘1 hope it won’t go 
too far!”

V ^ T ^ N ^ g i b s o n ’ s

Where you always 
buy the BEST for LESS

^Shop our everyday low prices plus 
these extra special super savings!

■ l H I A t T H  l  I t A U T Y  A I D S  y A t U l s l -

Discount
F A S H I O N  F O I I  P t  AW l i t S  l - l

G irls
Pre-w ashed

Denims

Reg. 1.89

SECRET
3oz. Roll-On Or 

l'doz. Anti- 
Perspirant Spray

Reg. 1.17 G*u

G i b s o n ' s
D i s h w a s h i n g

D e t e r g e n t
Pink Lemon or Green 
32 Oz Btl •c

Maalox
Liquid Anti-Acid 

12-Oz Btl

09

TIDE
K I N G  S I Z E  
R E G . 2 . 3 4

$188

B .

A. Regular & Slim jeans
Topstitchmg around waist 3  7  
leg A pocket Size 7 1 4 9 ®  Reg j  97

B. Regular & Slim Jeans 
3 7
Reg 6 97

Totitiching around waist 
A down legs Size 7 1 4

C .  Denim Big Top
Over blouse accented with 
topstitchmg Size 7 14 63 7

Reg 7 97

C A N N I N G  V A I U E S

FruH Jar Funnel
Houseware* 

No F l  4 — RfcG 1 ? 9

Can-Well Ladle
C»pn*»®l H o u W tm e i 
No IA  4 R fC , 1 ?0

Spring Canning Needs

97<

97*

Preserving Nettle
General HouMwaips 
No B 3 * n - R f G  4 9 7

Can-Well Caimer
Nc BZ? REG ?»,-

P lie r s
900 w **

bo* n

P«t«raoo 
Mo C10VYR
10 inch «€0

P R I C E S  G O O D  T H R U  M A R C H  1 3

Spotlight
3 4 7

Luncheon Honors  
Miss Wagnon

Miss Sherry Wagnon. bride- 
elect of Terry Dodd, was hon­
ored al a bridal luncheon, in the 
home of her aunt, Mrs. J.M. 
Wagnon. on Saturday. March 6.
The guests were seated at 

individual tables covered with 
w hile cloths and overlays of blue 
and w hite checked gingham and 
a small centerpiece of white 
poms and babys breath. A white 
cloth, with lace edging was used 
on the serving table, with a 
large centerpiece of white poms, 
gladiolas. babvs breath and blue 
and white gingham bows. Hot

chicken salad, broccoli casser­
ole. assorted salads and cheese­
cake were served.
Those attending besides the 

honoree were her mother, Mrs. 
W.B. Wagnon, Jr., her grand­
mother. Mrs. J.B. Wright. Mrs. 
Terry Field, Linda Shulz of 
Canyon. Lana Wagnon, Melissa 
Wagnon. Leslie Wagnon and 
the hostess.

* * * *
If you’re in doubt about 

saying something don’t 
say it.

Mrs. ( o r d a  Taylor Visits 
Scenic Cal ifornia
Mrs. Corda Taylor of Muleshoe 

and her granddaughter. Karen 
Oxborne, of Wavland flew out to 
Milpitas. California to visit Kar­
en’s parents, and Mrs. Taylor’s 
daughter and son-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Cecil Osborne.

While they were there, they 
toured San Francisco, went 
sightseeing, visited the Golden 
Gate Park and Fisherman’s 
Wharf. Another scenic attrac­
tion was China Tow. the odd 
buildings and the many people 
there.
They drove down Lomard 

Street, one of the most unusual 
streets in San Francisco. It is 
known as the crookiest street in 
the world.

Athletes...
Cont. from I’age 1 
coach was 34-8-2, and his Mor­
ristown East team went to the 
state playoffs. Dockery returned 
to his alma mater in 1970 under 
Coach Bill Battle and coached 
the receivers on the 1970 Volun­
teer Libeny Bowl Champions. 
Georgia Tech then put out a call 
for him and he joined Coach Bill 
Fulcher's staff as head offensive 
line coach. The Yellow Jackets 
went to the Liberty Bowl that 
year.

Dockery joined Coach Steve

Puliice
Cont. from Pa?e 1 
drill stolen.

Vandals struck Fry and Cox on 
March 3, by shooting holes 
through combine windows, with 
a B.B. Gun.
The American Legion Hall was 

the victim of vandalism. Win­
dows were shot with a B.B. 
Gun. on March 3.

Paul Scott, of 510 West 20 
reported a breakin at his home, 
on March 5. Everything was out 
■in the floor, but nothing ap­
peared to be missing.
On March 8. Fred Payne of the 

Mulcshoe Motel reported van­
dalism to a boys car parked by 
the band hall. Tires were 
slashed.

• ■ • ■ • ■ • ■ • ■ • ■ • ■ • ■ • ■ • a *  
■ ■

• Patterns •

• With A • 
S WESTERN Flair :

■ O N E S IZ E
•  F IT S  A LL
•  S I  25

•  L a d ie s ’ C a p e
2 Cape may be worn as 
2 a collared short cape or 
2 as a cape type vest
• Design changes by the
• different ways the cape
• is worn
2 P r i n t e d  pat t e r n  
2 #1239 in one size fits
• all Send SI 25 for this
2 pattern add 50C
2 handling and postage
• Send to
• Belle s Patterns
J  P O  Box 841 -  D ep t. 451 
■ Hurst. Texas 76053

T r o n m i e 1
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10 Years 
Ago

Mrs. Taylor also visited her 
oldest granddaughter and her 
husband. Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Somers, from Cloverdale. Cali­
fornia. She spent the weekend 
with them and attended church 
services, where Ronnie is pastor 
of the First Baptist Church, in 
Cloverdale.

Afterwards, from Cloverdale, 
Mrs. Taylor visited a sister-in- 
law and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Worth Hawkins, from Lodia, 
California, who is recovering 
from a heart attack.

Meeting her there, was anoth­
er sister-in-law and her hus­
band. Mr. and Mrs. Woodrow 
Copeland. Mrs. Taylor said. ” 1 
enjoyed my trip very much, but 1 
am glad to get back home.”

Sloan when he took the head job 
at Vanderbilt and then moved to 
Texas Tech with him in January, 
1975.
The banquet will be catered by 

Underwoods and the meal will 
consist of barbeque beef.

Dave Sudduth is chairman of 
the ticket sales. Tickets sell for 
$3.75 each and may be pur­
chased from Avis Grogan. Dave 
Sudduth. Gordon-Wilson Appli­
ance. Whitt, Watts, and 
Rempe; Baker Farm Supply, 
Williams Brothers Supply and 
the Chamber of Commerce of­
fice.

Carpenter...
Cont. from Page 1 
Plains Fair Grounds. The con­
test. scheduled to start at 2:30 
p.m.. will serve as the kick-off 
for this year's Show, which is 
the 42nd in the history of this 
Show, The Southwest Junior 
Livestock Show, one of the 
largest of its kind in the nation, 
will run for four days with over 
one thousand youngsters enter­
ing nearly two thousand animals 
in various categories.
The two winners of the Prin­

cess Contest will receive com­
plete accommodations during 
this four day stay plus an 
expense paid wardrobe of wes­
tern clothing. The two Princess­
es will attend all of the Show 
events and be on hand to 
present winner's ribbons and 
act as the official hostesses of 
the Show.

Bailey...
Cont. from z-age 1 
cubic feet.
O'Rourke added that estimated 

proved crude oil reserves were 
at their highest in the district in 
1970 with 3.130.328.000 barrels. 
Those reserves dropped off 18 
percent by 1974 to 2,578.203. 
000 barrels. The 1975 reserve 
figures are not yet available.

"Texas produces almost one- 
third of all the oil and gas used 
in this country and upcoming 
generations will be dependent 
on this energy,” O'Rourke said, 
"but we are subsidizing a few 
East coast states at the future 
expense of Texans."

"The East coast states must 
begin paying their fair share for 
our oil and gas and shouldering 
some of the responsibility for 
providing energy for this coun­
try,” he added.

B rie f, V e ry  B rief
Syria-Israel peace hopes 

appear dim.

Albert urges fellow Demos 
draft platform.

Dr. F. David Mathews nom- 
minated for new HEW post.

GI gets apology and refund 
from IRS.

Mr. and Mrs. T.R. White 
returned to Muleshoe Friday 
after a lengthy vacation. The 
Whites reported a very enjoy­
able time.

. . . . .
Muleshoe 4-H club met at 

Richland Hills Monday after­
noon when County Agent J.K. 
Adams was the speaker. He 
spoke on "How to Show Live­
stock", according to Carol 
Hodge, the reporter.

. . . . .
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Damron 

returned to Muleshoe Saturday 
night after spending two months 
at Rockport vacationing. Mrs. 
Damron reported they had quite 
a lot of fog but were glad they 
missed the cold weather Mule­
shoe experienced.

. . . . .
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Lcnau 

spent the weekend in Dallas 
visiting with their daughters. 
Pam and Lynn. The Lenaus 
returned to Muleshoe Sunday 
night.

20 Years
Ago

Mr. and Mrs. R.P. Glen and 
Linda and his brother, Oliver G. 
Glenn, spent the past weekend 
in Wheeler with her parents, 
B.F. Crosland. and her sister 
Mrs. Jewel Rinner and Faye. 

. . . . .
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Bass and 

son Terry Don. Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Bass, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leroy Farley, visited with the 
Henrv Bass' daughter and fami­
ly at Hereford last Sunday. 

. . . . .
Mr. and Mrs. G.T. Matlby 

were in Lubbock Friday, visiting 
and attending to business. 

. . . . .
Sue Actkinson, of Texas Tech 

spent the weekend here with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Troy 
Actkinson and others.

Arthur Crow, the Chevrolet 
man, must have breathed a 
sigh of relief this week when he 
heard the General Motors strike 
is over, and that the thousands 
of employees will go back to 
making new Chevrolets and 
repair parts for old ones. 

. . . . .
Mr. and Mrs. Houston Hart, 

and Mr. and Mrs. Woody 
Lambert spent the weekend in 
Fort Worth and Dallas and 
visited the Fat Stock show. 

. . . . .
Muleshoc airport is expanding. 

Bill Millen is now building a 
"T " hangar for his PT-19. 

. . . . .
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Green 

and Mr. and Mrs. Gordon 
Duncan attended the Fat Stock 
Show in Fort Worth last week. 

. . . . .
Mr. and Mrs. Morris Douglass 

spent the weekend in Dallas.

C h u r c h  H a s  
M e e t i n g

Rev. James LeFan has spent 
all but six years of his preaching 
life with the Western Hills 
church in Temple. having 
moved there 25 years ago.
Rev. Joe Barnett recently com­

mented concerning Rev. LeFan, 
"And James LeFan has proved 
himself to be a master crafts­
man as a church builder. His 
preaching, conducts, attitudes, 
and disposition are exemplary.''

Rev. LeFan can be heard the 
next two Sunday mornings at 
8:45. on KMUL on the program. 
“ Speaking the Truth in Love" 
and in person during the meet­
ing. March 14-17.

You are invited 
to hear 

JAMES LeFAN 
in a series of meetings 

Merch 14 thru 17 
at Muleshoe Church of 

Christ 2205 West 
American Boulevard 
Muleshoe, Texas

Song Leader;
Jaque Baker

JAMES LeFAN
S C H E D U L E  

W H h  D .y *  - 10: 
Sunday - 9 :3 0  a .m .

O F  S E R V IC E S  

00 a .m . L 7:10 p .m . 

10:20 a .m . A  6 :00  o .i

L » j »V. v



At Muleshoe Junior High
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NJH Holds  History Fair
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MJH Science  Fair
IThc Muleshoe Junior High 
students had their Science Fair 
On Tuesday night. March 2. The 
seventh graders had their's in 
Mrs. Scoggin's room No. 0. The 
sixth graders had their's in Mrs. 
Gunter's room No. 9.

They had many students enter 
the science fair and they had 
several winners, too. The sev­
enth graders had many good 
projects. The seventh grade 
winners were: Grand went to 
Sails Lunsford and Juanita Lo- 
/ana. First place winners were 
Shelli Hawkins and Sharon Car­
penter. Benny f’ena got second 
on his project. Third place went 
to Clifford Watson. They were 
were three Honorable Mentions 
that went to Jeff Hyde and Steve 
Clay brook for their project. The 
other Honorable Mentions went

G i r l s  T r a c k
This year, for the first time the 

.girls will be organizing a track 
and field team. Also for the first 
time the eighth grade girls will 
be running in competition.

For the last two weeks, the 
girls have been w orking out and 
getting in shape for the upcom­
ing track meet at Hereford.
The track and field events will 

be the bO yard dash. 440 and bbO 
yard relay. 60 yard low hurdles, 
high jump, shot-put. and discus.

I he girls track meet w ill be on 
March lb.

to Jimmy Gl< an and to Debra 
Evens.

The sixth grade winners were: 
Grand went to Robin Burgess, 
and Stacey Campbell. The first 
place ribbon went to Judy 
Biggerstaff and Paula Williams. 
Susie Pierce and Donna Haw - 
kins got second place ribbon. 
The third went to Lori Harline 
and Sherri Henry. Honorable 
Mention went to Jesse Severs 
dorf. Beatrice Reyna got an 
Honorable Mention. Then Janet 
Shain got an Honorable Mention 
ribbon.
Congratulations to all of these 

students!

The Muleshoe Junior High 
School history fair was held on 
March 2 front 7 to 9 p.m. The 
winners are as follows: Eighth 
grade - Grand Champion - Joel 
Bratcher. The name of his 
project was "Benjamin Frank­
lin": first place. Benny Har­
mon. "Irrigation in Bailey 
County"; second place. Shelley 
Splawn. Brenda Dodd, JoRonda 
Rhodes. Linda Shafer. Sharia 
Henry, and Sandy Dunbar. 
These girls made a quilt with 
different pictures of American 
History; third place. Larry Par­
ker and Cody Crittenden. "200 
years in transportation and bat 
ties"; Honorable Mention. 
Manual Garcia. “ Colonia Mon­
ey"; Sandra Hughes. "Iroquois 
Indians"; Frantonya Berry hill 
and Gina Angeles. "Symbols 
used in Radio"; Jo Garth and 
Patty Moore. "The Book", 
of the Plains Indians"; Tammy 
Buckner and Deanna Smith. 
"West Texas Town” and Benny 
Pena. "Dugout” .

I he students that have placed 
in the Muleshoe History Fair 
will take their projects to the 
Plains iew History Fair on April 
I fhe Journalism Staff would 
like to congratulate the students 
that placed in Muleshoe and 
wish them luck at Plainsiexx.

I hose students w ho didn't do a 
project wrote a five page report. 
The winners arc as follows: first 
place. Lamont Lewis. "Ameri­
can Space Exploration"; second 
place. Sherri Reese. "Benjamin 
Franklin"; third place. Karen 
Smith. "Texas” : fourth place. 
Rebecca Gatewood. "The Battle 
of Plum Creek" and fifth place. 
Darla Ramage. "The Battle of 
San Jacinto".

Seventh grade winners are as 
follows: Grand Champion. Les­
lie Cowan and Tonya Howard. 
"Landmarks in Bailey County", 
first place, Orpha Pecina and 
Diana Saldana. "Plantation 
Farm"; second place. Juanita

Muleshoe Junior High Honor Roll
The honor roll tor the fourth six 

weeks at Muleshoe Junior High 
Schools is as follows:
SIXTH GRADE: Kristi Henry. 
Cindy Turner. Lupe Rosales. 
Debra Bouchelle. Curtis Wheel­
er. Sherri Henry. Jan Whitt, 
Francis Saldana and Ferric Mar­
tin.

Also. Jamev Chances. Cara 
Bass, Stacey Campbell. Shelley 
Davis and Michelle Brxant.
SEVENTH GRADE: Leslie 

Cowan, Clifford Watson, Carroll 
Precure, Keva Roming, Tena 
Landers. Michelle Agee. Sally 
Lunsford. Benny Pena, Curby 
Brantlev and Kathleen Patter­

And. Casey Farmer, Nancy 
Garcia. Albert Lopez. Deborah 
Evetts, Brad Povnor, Benton 
Glaze. Brenda Stevens. Curtis 
Hunt. Diana Saldana and Juani­
ta Lozano.

Also. Mary Mata. Lupe Pache­
co. Tyree Wagnon. Carla Shaf­
er. Johnny Puckett and Sandy 
Rojas.

EIGHTH GRADE: JoRonda 
Rhodes. Christine Isaac. Cindy 
Hamblen. Jesse Lackey. Shelly 
Dunham. Debra Stevens. Man­
uel Garcia. Mark Northcutt and 
Scott Baker.
Also. Pam Young. Brenda 

Dodd. Mike Henry. Shelly 
Splawn. Robert King and Kan- 
etha Hysinger.

7th Crude Tournament  
Takes Place

Hth G r a d e  T r a c k  S t a r t s
On February 25. the Eighth 

grade boys in athletics painfully 
started track. They started 
workout with a regular routine 
of exercising and running. Their 
coaches are Coach Lynn and 
Coach Crook. Coach Lvnn start-

btoehs News
By M r s . J  O .  Bay U s s

Reason 2 At H&R Block our 
price is based on the 
complexity of your return 
The simpler the return, the 
less we charge

H&R BLOCK
THE INCOM E TAX P EO P LE

224 W 2nd
Weekdays - 9-6 Sat - 9-5 

272-3283

ed off by working with the 
sprinters and hurdlers and 
Coach Crook took the distance 
runners. Their first track meet 
was on March 5 at Farwell. The 
seventh and eighth grade com­
peted there, wanting to come 
back with a victors.

E.N. McCall returned home 
-Monday, from the St. Mary's 
Hospital in Lubbock. He was 
able to attend church Sunday.

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Orbc Phillips. 

Star Rt., Portales. and children. 
Johnny, of Lubbock. Gary and 
Clyde of Stegal area and his 
brother. Monroe Phillips, of 
Littlefield, were dinner guests, 
in the home of his sister. Mr. 
and Mrs. Loyd Pollard, last 
Sunday. The Pollards sons. Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry Pollard and 
family, of Tahoka and Mr. and 
Mrs. Lamar Pollard and family, 
of Lcvelland were guests, also.

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Autrv spent 
Thursday night with their son. 
Mr. and Mrs. George Autry and 
family, at Pep. New Mexico. 
Then they drove to Clovis, New 
Mexico and visited a daughter. 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Jackson, 
until Saturday.

* * * * •
Claud Bass has been a patient 

in the Morton hospital the past
week.

* * * * *
Winnie Bayars went to Fort 

Worth with her son. Tom Byers, 
where she visited Mrs. Ruth 
York, and Mr. and Mrs. E. 
Gilbert. June Morton, from 
Mesquite came over to visit with 
them. She spent Tuesday night 
with her daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Parr, in Lubbock, 
before returning home. Wed­
nesday.

* * *  *  *

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Coffman 
of Muleshoe and Mrs. J.D. 
Bayless visited their brother. 
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Coffman in
Morton, Saturday afternoon.

+  * * *

Some people leave their 
manners at home when 
driving.

Henry Block has 
17 reasons why 

you should come 
to us for income 

tax help.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Sowder had 
all of their children home. 
Sunday. Those attending were 
Mr. and Mrs. Pat Risinger and 
children, of Three-Way; Mr. 
and Mrs. Terry Sowder of the 
Enochs area; Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve Newton, of Lubbock; Jer­
ry. of Lcvelland: Mrs. Sowder. 
and Mrs. Opal Ruth Sowder.

•  •  •  *  *

Clifford Snitker was admitted 
to the West Plains Hospital in 
Muleshoe Sunday afternoon for
tests.

On Thursday. February 19. 
and Friday. February 20, the 
seventh graders had the finals 
of their tournament. Thursday 
four teams played for fifth, 
sixth, seventh and eighth plac­
es. The Globetrotters played the 
Lakers for seventh and eighth 
places. The score was Globetrot­
ters eight. Lakers two. Then the 
Bucks played the Chaps for fifth 
and sixth places. The score then 
was Bucks 12 and Chaps four. 
Then on Friday the Knicks were

The Bill Key family, along with 
all of the W.L. Key children met 
at the Littlefield Community 
Center Sunday, to celebrate 
W.L. Key’s 90 birthday. There 
were a 100 relatives and old 
friends attending the occasion. 

* * * * *
Dinner guests, in the home of 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Coats, 
Sunday were his parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. Oscar Coats of Mor­
ton. her mother, Mrs. Alma 
Altman, a son. Mr. and Mrs. 
Keith Coats, of Levelland and

FANTASIES 
OF FASHION

99

S H O P

C A S H

L A Y A W A Y

Spend your casual times in these natural sandals They're made for fun 
with genuine leather woven strapping uppers, wood wedge and comfy 
cushion crepe sole Sizes 5 to 10.

lo r u / L
A  N  T  H  O  N  V C O
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TEXAS

Lozano. "Brands of West 
Texas"; third place. Carroll 
Procure and Benton Glaze. 
"Commanchc Indian Culture"; 
Honorable Mentions. Maria Flo­
res and Debbie Rcvna. "Homes

B a i l < kv . . .
Coat, from Pi^3 !
O'Grady. Glen Long. Martin 
Nowlin, Royce Hamilton. Dave 
Smith. John Dean, and Ricky 
King.
Officer election were held w ith

Mole.hoe Journal, Thursday Murch II , 1976, Page 5
David Smith being elected pres­
ident: Bill Durham, vice-presi­
dent; John Dean, secretary; and 
Mike O'Gradv, treasurer.
The group will meet monthly 

with meeting times to be an­
nounced. All young adults be­
tween the ages of 14 and 35 w ho 
are interested in learning more

about the American political 
system may joing the organiza­
tion b\ calling David Smith. 
272-4270, Bill Durham. 272 
3438. John Dean 272-4096. or 
Mike O'Gradv. 272-3974.

defeated by the Caltics 16-five 
for third and fourth places. Then 
lor the championship the Bruins 
were upset by the Warriors by a 
score of 12-eight.

In summary, the final stand­
ings were: First place - War­
riors: Second place. Bruins; 
Third place. Celtics; Fourth 
place. Knicks; Fifth place, 
Bucks; Sixth place. Chaps; Sev­
enth place. Globetrotters and 
Eighth place. Lakers.

Randy Carruth, of Hobbs. 
* * * * *

Teresa Autrv. of Pep, New 
Mexico spent the weekend with 
Paula Nichols and attended 
church with her Sunday. 

* * * * *
Mrs. Jack Parr and children of 

Lubbock were supper guests in 
the home of her mother. Mrs. 
Winnie Byars. Eldon Byars wa* 
also a guest. They all went to 
Friona Sunday to visit the Ted 
Rener's. She is the daughter of 
Mrs. Parr.

OPEN 24 
HOURS

JOIN THE 
BIGGEST 
SALE OF 

THE YEAR!

Q ? 4£ 7 1

A L L ! S I u 1
1

s

L CONVENIENCE STORES |

OPEN 24 
HOURS

PRICES GOOD 
MARCH M 3 .

1976

SAVINGS STREET l famum
^ ^ ■ Q A Y S B B H Ithru-out ours

t j .  BACON
1 LB. PKG.

VACUUM
PACKED

SPECIAL GROCERY SAVINGS

|  SHURFRESH FRANKS OR

BOLOGNA
^  12 0 Z.P K G .

YOUR
CHOICE

ALLSUP S DAIRY FAVORITES
SHURFINE M  n f l  HALFMOON L0H8H0RR A A A

DINNER 7SST 4,™,.51 00 COLBY CHEESE 8 9 c
HAMBURGER SLICED P A R  SWEETMILK OR BUTTERMILK f t  0  4  0 1 1

PICKLES 5 9 c BISCUITS 9 5 1 00
SHURFRESH f t  A A A  BORDER A A A

SALTINES 2  mus 8 9 c COTTAGE CHEESE S  7 9 C
SOFLIN A  O A P  SHURFRESH M %  A A A

PAPER TOWELS 2  -SB? 8 9 c MARGARINE 3 8 9 °
SHURFINE

FLOUR
5 LB.BAG

1 s* Bag With Coupon From 
Any Affiliated Foods 

Circular And An Additional 
$7 SO Purchase Excluding 
Cigarettes Thereafter 
Or Without Coupon 69

1
GMAMOLAWO

S U G A R

SHURFINE

SUGAR
5 LB. BAG

1 st Bag With Coupon From 
Any Affiliated Foods 

Circular And An Additional 
S7 50 Purchase Excluding 
Cigarettes Thereafter 

Or Without Coupon SI 09

SHURFINE
I  GREEN BEANS

BLEACH GAL.
BTL.

SHURFINE

SHORTENING
3 LB. CAN

1 st Can W th Coupon From 
Any Affiliated Foods 

Circular And An Additional 
$7 SO Purchase Excluding 
Cigarettes Thereafter 

Or Without Coupon SI 09

SHURFINE ALL 6RINDS

COFFEE
1 LB. CAN

1 st Can With Coupon From 
Any Affiliated Foods 

Circular And An Additional 
S7 SO Purchase Excluding 
Cigarettes Thereafter 

Or Without Coupon SI 09

0RAN6E 4 S I  00 
JUICE s i

WASH RED DEL _ _  CALIF. HAVEL

APPLES OR ORANGES
MIX 'N 
MATCH

CRINKLE 1 
POTATOES..-,,59c
SHURFINE EVAPORATED M
MILK «SHURFINE FRUIT Ml
COCKTAIL 3SHURFINE mfinny whole kernel nIfUlM ON CREAM STYLE .... "V

L,8 9 c
L » 1 “
IS02. S i 00CANS 1

GARDEN FRESH * n  l | A |

UTILITY POTATOES ’ Si' 6 9 '
SHOP THE FRIENDLY. CONVENIENT 

ALLSUP S STORE NEAR YOUI

HOT COOKED FOODS
.  BBQ CHICKEN .0 0 0  RIBS 
.H O T  LINKS .M ILD  LINKS 

.B ER M A N  SAUSAGE 
.  BURRITOS .CORN DOGS

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

• IISUM »H ■UllSMOt Itltl

4 1 4  W .  A M E R I C A N  B L V D
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“ PRIDE" WINS . . . Eddie Black's light weight Limousine steer
placed second in the recent San Antonio Exposition. Eddie is shown 
with his dad. Muleshoe City Police Chief Buddy Black.

"CUTTER RUSTY" WINS . . This middle weight red Angus steer shown bv .lintim Lee Gleason and 
ow tied In his younger brother, .lay. placed first in his class and won Reserve Champion of the show at the 
San Antonio Exposition reccnlh Spencer Tanksley poses with Or. and Mrs. ,lcrr\ Gleason and .I ilium.

“ MIGHT! MOUSE" TAKES FIRST . . Jimmy Lee Gleason has a smile almost as big as his dad,
(center) l)r Jerry Gleason, as he poses with his first place light weight Angus steer. Bailev County Agent
Spencer Tankslev looks on.

"BLACK BEAUTY" . . . Takes first place in the light weight Limousine Division at the San Antonio
Imposition. He is shown with his owner. Stacy Kirby. TAKES FIRST . . . Craig Kirby placed first in the light weight

Maine-Anjou division with his steer "Red Eve” .

raised matching funds will 
match, the new facility will soon 
be eonstructed in the City of 
Muleshoe.

Hospi t al . . .
Coat, from P ije  1 
San Antonio school.

|)r. Daniel McCarty. Jr., the 
physician who first isolated 
pseudogout as a separate arthri­
tis type, will be included in the 
discussion panel.

Additional information will be 
discussed concerning newer me­
dications for arthritis. new diag­
nostic techniques and the value 
of analyzing fluid from an 
inflammcd joint.

Moderator for the discussions 
will be Dr. Robert Pcrsellin. 
professor of medicine at the San 
Antonio center.
Panelists will include Dr. 

Met arts, professor and chair­
man of medicine at the llnivcrsi- 
ty of Wisconsin Medical Col­
lege; Dr. Charles Singleton, 
clinical assistant professor of 
medicine at the UT center and 
director of rheumatology at 
Wilford Hall USAF Medical 
Center; and Dr. James Wild, 
clinical instructor of medicine at 
the UT center.

“ PRIDE" DOES IT . . .  He placed second in the light weight Maine-Anjou Division at the recent San 
Antonio Exposition. Shown with the steer is Kelly Harrison.

DELMER . . Brian Kirby placed second with his middle weight Charolais named "Delmer" in the 
recent San Antonio Exposition.

Final...

"BO" TAKES SECOND Carol Black is shown with her father Buddy Black of Muleshoe with her
si i mid plan I nglish ( mss mil "Bu" during the San Antonio Exposition.

Cont. from Page 1 
had an obligation to meet at the 
local bank and the citizens 
committee not only raised the 
necessary funds to meet the 
bank obligation, but to add a 
w ing to the present hospital and 
renovate the present building.
The members of the citizens 

committee are not members of 
the present hospital board, but 
are just concerned citizens nom­
inated and elected during a 
public meeting, who have taken 
it upon themselves to raise the 
much needed funds. With the 
help of numerous service clubs 
ami other organizations as well 
as private citizens, the project 
has been a complete success.

It has been a long bumpy road 
to travel, but it looks like with 
the final drawings having been 
sent to Austin for approval, 
target date for construction is 
not far away.
The committee has accomp­

lished what they set out to do -- 
to keep this hospital in operation 
and trv and build a new facility.

With assistance from Farmers 
Home Administration and other 
federal funds, which locally

4-H ersFare We 11 At Li vestock Show
P a r t i c i p a n t s  Br ing  
Home Top Honors

Several Bailey County 4-Hers 
attended the Houston Livestock 
Show and Rodeo recently and 
"did quite well", according to 
Bailey County Extension Agent 
Spencer Tankslcy.
Jimmy Lee Gleason, son of Dr. 

and Mrs. Jerry Gleason of 
Muleshoe showed the first place 
Chianina Steer, "Hi Sherrif". 
weighing 1044 pounds. The 
steer who was named after 
Bailey County Sherrif Dee Cle­
ments who bred him. was first 
place in the light weight divi­
sion.
Jimmy also showed the first 

place heavy weight champion 
Hampshire Barrow, bred bv 
Jimmy Seaton at Lazbuddic, 
using a sow owned by Jimmy 
Gleason. The Barrow weighed 
242 pounds.
Other winners at the Houston 

Show included Greg Harrison,
"SI NSIIINF." The sun does shine over Kelly Harrison, his dad and Bailey County Extension Agent who took second place with his 
Spencer I ankslcv as thev proudly pose w ith the first place heavy weight champion Shorthorn Steer of the heavy weight OPB Yorkshire 
show in the recent San Antonio Exposition. Barrow, weighing 241 pounds.

Jerry Lionel Gleason, second 
place middle weight Berkshire 
Barrow, tipping the scales at 
225 pounds.

Darrell Rasco placed fifth with 
his heavy weight Chester Bar- 
row weighing in at 238 pounds. 
Jacinda Gleason placed eighth 

with her heavy weight Du rex.' 
Barrow; and Sheryl Rasco. 14th 
with her heavy weight Duroc 
barrow.
Other winners in steers includ­

ed Kirk Lewis, who took fourth 
with his heavy weight English 
Cross; Kelly Harrison, sixth 
with his middle weight Maine 
Anjou; Belinda Wheeler, ninth 
in the middle weight class with 
her Limousine steer; and Allan 
Harrison who placed 15th with 
his light weight Limousine

steer.
Other youth exhibiting steers 

but not placing at Houston were 
lav Gleason. Jacinda Gleason 
jnd Cammie Wagner.

I ankslcv says ten Bailey Coun­
ty 4-Hers exhibited 27 barrows 
at San Antonio Livestock Show 
and the following awards were 
won;
Second place heavy weight 

Hampshire Barrow was shown 
bv Jimmy Gleason; third place 
went to Jay Gleason and his 
middle weight cross; while Tra- 
cv Tunnel showed the third 
place heavy weight Polland. 
Greg Harrison showed the 

seventh place middle weight 
Polland and Darrell Rasco 
showed the seventh placed mid­
dle weight Cross.
Tracy Tunnell’s light weight 

York placed eighth and Greg 
Harrison showed the ninth place 
heavy weight Hampshire. Also 
placing ninth with his light 
weight Cross was Tracy Tun- 
nell. Tracy also had the eleventh 
place heavy weight Spot, while 
Jerry Gleason showed the 12th 
place heavy weight Duroc.

Darwin Shaw placed 13th with 
his middle weight Hampshire 
and Jacinda Gleason place 15th 
with her middle weight Hamp­
shire. Sixteenth place in the 
light weight Hampshire division 

•went to Jason Scoggins.
Bailey County Agent Tanksley 

feels these youngsters did quite 
well in these two shows and 
feels they should be commend­
ed for their efforts. A lot of hard 
work and determination goes 
into getting an animal ready to 
show. A number of Bailey 
County 4-Hers will attend the 
show in Lubbock in the near 
future.

FIRST PLACE . .
Simmental "Jack .....................
I anksley, his father, and sister Carol.

Eddie Black, son of Mr. and Mrs. Buddv Black proudly poses with his first place
in the San Antonio Exposition. With him is (l-r) Bailey County Agent Spencer

E D
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W f f t l N T
TO BUY? 

TO SELL? 
RESULTS?

OPEN RATES
1st insertion, per word - 9? 
2nd and add., per word - 6y .

NATIONAL RATES 
1st insertion, per word - I lf  
2nd and add., per word - 7? 
Minimum Charge - 50?
CARD OF THANKS - $3.00 
Classified Display '$1.25 
per column inch.
Double Rate for Blind Ads - 
DEADLINE FOR INSERTION 
Noon Tuesday for Thursday 
Noon Friday for Sunday 
WE RESERVE THE 
Right to classify, revise or 
reject any ad.
NOT RESPONSIBLE 
For any erro r after ad has 
run once.

rOR SALE: 1972 Pontiac Cata­
lina Brougham and 1909 Cadil­
lac El Durado. Both in good 
condition. Contact Jeri Wiede- 
bush. Wiedebush and Co.
8-1 lt-2tc

FOR SALE: 1972 Chevrolet 
Monte Carlo. Blue and white. 
Power, air. tape deck. Only 
47,000 miles, for $3,000. See at 
Cashwav Grocery or call 272- 
5055.
9 9t tfc

•••••••••••••»•••••••••••••••
l PERSONAL

1 will not be responsible for any 
debts other than my own. 

Sandra Walker.
1-llt-ltp

3. HELP WANTED..................

WANTED: Still taking appli­
cations for workers at Allsup's
7- 11.
J-46s-4tc

WANTED: Mechanic 5-day 
work week; excellent woiking 
condition. Crow Chevrolet.
3 49t tfc

HELP WANTED: Town and 
Country Auto Inc. Auto and 
Truck Mechanic. Good working 
conditions.
3-7s-tfc

HOMEWORKERS NEEDED in
this area to lace lethcr goods at 
home. Eart $150 per week. No 
experience necessary. Send $1 
(refundable) and long stamped 
envelope to:

CUMBERLAND LEATHER- 
CRAFT

1516 MAJIC VIEW DRIVE 
KINGSPORT, TENNESSEE 

37600
3-IOs-3tp

’5.’’ A P $ T m’e NTS FOR R ENT ~
........................................................ ...............................................................VI

MOVING NOW - Nice 1. 2 and 3 
bedroom apartments. Fully car­
peted, individual heat-air. I 1/2 
baths, utilities paid. play­
ground. laundry facilities. 

Saratoga Gardens 
1300 Walnut Street 

Friona, Texas 
247-3666 

Office hours 10-6
5- 3t-tfc

*'*6*"f o r "'r ENT.................

FOR RENT: A bedroom. Call 
272-4831.
6- 9s-4tc

Bedroom to rent with kitchen 
priviledges. 272-3815.
6-!0t-3tc

FOR RENT: One large office 
with two rooms and carpet. One 
small office reasonable. Phone 
272-3394 or see Retail Mer­
chants, 117 West Avenue D. 
6-IOs-3tc
........................................... .
3. . & £ &  EST ATE FOR SALE
FOR SALE: 2 bedroom and 
bath, large living room. Kitchen 
and dining room combination. 
Refinished throughout. Call 
965-2868.
8- 7t-tfc

10. FARM EQUIP. FOR SALE

FOR SALE: Corn Dryer. Used 
one season. A-28 Dri-All. Dryer 
with dry creation. Contact 
TAGO INDUSTRIES INC. Here­
ford. 806-357-2222 or mobile 
phone 265-3661. Call collect 
lodav.
10-4s-tfc

Your neighbors trade at STATE 
LINE IRRIGATION for all their 
irrigation needs. Why not you? 
Muleshoe, Littlefield, & Level- 
land.
10- 45s-tfc

1L ’ FOR" S A LE' OR TR ADE ‘

FOR SALE: In Muleshoe. Near­
ly new spinet piano. Concert 
approved. Tremendous bargain. 
This is your chance to own a fine 
piano by assuming small pay­
ments. Write at once -

McFarland  m usic  c o .
1401 WEST 3RD 

ELK CITY. OKLAHOMA 73M4
Ut-ltp

FOR SALE: Grain-fed beef 
calves. For your locker. 1/2 or 
whole. 925-3510. leldon Phillips 
11 -2t-tfc

FOR SALE: Beauty Shop equip­
ment. 965-2622.
1 l-3s-tfc

FOR SALE: Attrex. Milogard 
$2.70. Treflan Eradicane and 
Round-up. Wholesale on most 
all Ag. chemicals - Farmers 
sales - Dendy . . . Lorenzo. Call 
806-634-5382.
11- 50s-3ltc

FOR SALE: 1973 Open Road 
(MOTORHOME) 20'. Excellent 
condition. 272-4047 evenings.
11-1 lt-3ttlsp

290 acres with sprinkler $600 
a good buy.
354 acres at $600 per acre.
32 acres with 3-2 bedroom 

houses. Good buy.
240 acres of cat claw land 

$250.
354 acres of dry land $110. A 

good buy.
5 bay car wash with Texaco 

Service Station.
Commercial lots. Priced to 

sell.
Commercial building 1920 ft. 

floor space. Good buy.
2 and 3 bedroom houses.
28 acres for sale 30 x 32 house 
and barnes. Water well close 
in. Price 18.000.
We have other listings also. 

Your listing appreciated.
E.H. HALL REAL ESTATE 

505 AUSTIN 272-4784 
8-10t-4tc

-**•••••• •••••••• ••••••••
13 FOR RENT OR LEASE

FOR RENT OR LEASE: Busi­
ness building. 5200 square feet. 
422 N. 1st. 272-3767. 
l3-5s-tfc

is. MBC ELL AN EOUS

AND

In Bailey ̂ om u'V d Years

B R I M *  
R E A L  E S T A T E

210 S. 1st_________

FOR SALE- 7 used side rows. 
6.000 ft. 4" sprinkler pipe. 
Contact A.V.I. Inc. 272-4266. 
15-37s-tfc

FOR SALE: Choice alfalfa hav. 
Out of barn. Ton or truck load 
lots. McDcrmett Cattle Co. 266- 
5666 day. 266-5251 night Mor­
ton. Tex. 
l5-6s-8tc

FOR SALE: 4 bdr., 2 bath, 
brick home. Fully carpeted 
and drapes. $18000 
FOR SALE: ’/, sec. good 
land. 5 miles n.w. of Mule­
shoe. I 8" irrigation well. 2 
bdr. house.
8-46t-tfc

Smallwood Real Estate 
116 E. Ave. C 

Muleshoe, Texas

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 660
acres dry land farm. 284 acres in 
soilbank grass. Balance in na- 
.tivc grass. Could all be farmed. 

Three bedroom house. Five 
stall dairy barn. Parlor type 
haybarn. th ree cow sheds. $150 
and 29 percent down. Owner 
will carry balance. Four miles 
west, two north of Floyd. New 
Mexico.

ELGIN FOWLER 
FLOYD, NEW MEXICO 

88118
8- l0s-2tp

• ' ' »M<«I!U I S

FOR SALE: 69 oldsmobile 442. 
Good engine. Good condition. 
See at Strahan Garage or call 
965-2998 after 5 p.m.
9- l()t 4tp

WE NEED YOUR 
LISTINGS

POOL REAL ESTATE 
214 E. AMERICAN BI.VD.

FOR SALE: 1/2 mile 5" x 40" 
drag line alum. pipe. I mile of 
aluminum 4” x 30 ft. hand 
moved line pipe. 30 joint 8 flow 
line pipe. 10 joints 7" flow line 
pipe. 15 joints 6” flow line pipe. 
Call 272-4268.
10-5s-tfc

.' OR SAI F: 320 acres irrigated, 
lavs nearly perfect. West Camp 
Area. 160 A irr , Lazbudiie 
area. Priced for imrnc.fta'e 
s a le .

J.B. SUDDERTH 
REALTY INC. 
806-481-3288

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 1970 
two bedroom mobile home. Call 
272-4411.
IS- I0s-4tc

FOR SALE: 5 - one bedroom. I 
two bedroom houses to be 
moved. Contact 272-4511. ED­
WIN COX.
8-8s-6tcc

Industrial and residential elec­
trician. Reasonable rates. Phone 
272 4153.
IS- 10t-4tp

TEA Se a r c he s Fo r  Ha nd i c a p p e d Ch i l d r e n

COX SPRAYING 
GREENBUGS- WHEAT 

TREFLAN. Roundup 
New precision ground rig.
For all your spraying needs. 

BULA 806-933-2300
15-3s-tfc

AUSTIN -  The Texas Educa­
tion Agency (TEA) is beginning 
a statewide effort to locate and 
identify every handicapped 
child of school age not now in 
school,

Slate Board of education Chair­
man Joe Kelly Butler of Hous­
ton announced the beginning of 
project “ Child Find" at a Capi­
tol news conference in Austin. 
“ Child Find", he said, “ is 

designed to search out young 
people between the ages of 
three and 21 who are blind, 
deaf, physically handicapped, 
emotionally disturbed, or men­
tally retarded, and those with 
learning diabilities."
The program will be imple­

mented by education service

centers in 20 regions throughout 
Texas, with the cooperation of 
the state's 1.121 independent 
school districts. In each region, 
door-to-door contacts will be 
made in one specific community 
served by a school district with 
an average daily attendance of 
approximately 3,000 students.

Kelly said through the news 
media and through door-to-door 
canvasses, handicapped chil­
dren not in school will be 
contacted, their families will 
receive counseling services, and 
the children will begin receiving 
the education they need.

No statistics are available on 
the number of uneducated han­
dicapped children, Butler said. 
"We believe the number is

above 10.000 children. These 
children are not receiving edu­
cational services promised them 
b\ Texas law. and it is the duty 
of public education agencies to 
make their parents or guardians 
aware that free special educa­
tion is available.

"Texas has made dramatic 
improvements in special educa­
tion," Butler added. "Today, 
public education is serving more 
than 300.000 students in special 
education programs. But that is 
only 76 percent of the handi­
capped children now in the 
state. It is the goal of public 
education to be serving the 
needs of every handicapped 
child in Texas between the ages

PHILLIPS HOUSE OF MUSIC 
118 Main

Clovis, New Mexico
Pianos, organs, band instru­
ments, new and used. Profes­
sional repairs, sheet music, 
rentals, terms.

Phone: 505-763-5041. 
15-30s-tfc

1EPENDABLE SERVICE.
3ackhoe • Front loader Cess­
pool Pumping. Drain Clean­
ing. Roto-Rootcr. Roto-Tilling. 
Light Hauling. DWAIN 
kHEAT 272-3378. If no an­

swer call at noon or after 5 | 
.m.

jis-nt-tfc

A public hearing shall be held 
concerning the 1976-77 budget 
of the City of Muleshoe at the 
City Hall in Muleshoe. Texas, at 
8:30 a.m.. March 16, 1976. 
Proposed expenditures concern­
ing entitlement HI of the Gener­
al Revenue Sharing Act will also 
be discussed. The meeting is 
open to the public.

Mary Watkins 
City Secretary 

llt-ltc

I Bulldozer work. 965-2622. 
15- l l t -t f c

Di a be t i c  Camp Set  
To Open May 30

C amp Sweeney Diabetic Edu­
cational Training Center for 
diabetic boys and girls (six 
through 16 years of age) will 
open for the 27 year of operation 
May 30. 1976 with three-three 
weeks sessions as follows: May 
30 to June 19, June 20 to July 10 
and July 11 to July 31.
Camp Sweeney is located nine 

miles cast and one mile north of 
Gainesville. Texas on 338 acres 
of beautiful rolling timbered 
hills with three dormitories for 
boys and three for girls; a 
non-dcnominational chapel; a 
modern hospital; a 30 acre lake 
for boating, fishing and water- 
skiing; a sanitary swimming 
pool, tennis courts, recreational 
pavilion, target range and 20 
gentle saddle horses.

Under the supervision of a 
specialized medical staff, dieti- 
tion and counsellors, these chil­
dren arc taught their proper diet 
with regulated exercise, how to 
take their own urine tests and 
give their own insulin injections. 
Of major importance, through 
this group association with other 
young diabetics, they realize 
they arc not alone with their 
disorder and with proper know­
ledge and instruction they can 
learn how to live with their 
lifelong companion - diabetes.

Diabetes is herediatry, incura­
ble and increasing yearly. It is 
the third killer of diseases and 
ranks third as the cause of 
blindness. Medical authorities 
estimate one-fourth of the 
World's population carries the 
diabetic gene and some 5.000, 
000 cases of diabetes are in the 
United States of which more 
than 500.(XX) are children.
Camp Sweeney, operated and 

maintained by Southwestern Di­
abetic Foundation. Inc., is an 
organizational member of Texas 
United Community Services of 
Texas. If you know or hear of a 
diabetic child who needs our

help please refer them to this 
office, their local United Fund or 
Jaycee Club or any Jaycee Club 
in Louisiana.
The Southwestern Diabetic 

Foundation. Inc. is a charitable, 
non-profit corporation located at 
101 South Culberson. Gaines­
ville. Texas. If you would like to 
help financially carry on this 
humanitarian program, please 
write direct to the Foundation 
office. For application blanks, 
brochures, etc. write direct to 
James V. Campbell, Camp 
Sweeney Director or Southwes­
tern Diabetic Foundation. Inc., 
P.O. Drawer 918. Gainesville. 
Texas. 76240.

Haddon Last Kites Held
Funeral services for Nolan 

Martin Haddon, 60 of Paducah 
were held at 2 p.m. Saturday at 
the Primitive Baptist Church in 
Paducah with Elder Luther Por­
ter officiating.
Burial was in Garden of Mem­

ories Cemetery in Paducah un- 
( der the direction of Norris 
Funeral Home.

Haddon died at 2:30 p.m. 
Friday in Richards Memorial 
Hospital in Paducah.

Born in Miydcr, Oklahoma, he 
was a resident of Cottle County 
for 56 years. He was a retired 
farmer and a member of the 
Primitive Baptist Church.
Survivors include his wife, 

Clare; four sons. Dennis C. of 
Pampa, Wayne A. and Arien D., 
both of Seminole, and Gerald L. 
of Muleshoe; two brothers, Carl 
of Chula Vista, California and 
Fred G. of San Bernadino. 
California; and four grandchil­
dren.
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Because we know irrigation like nobody knows 
irrigation. We’ll be glad to give you all the technical 
assistance you need in planning your next irrigation 
system.

First and foremost, that means complete irriga 
tion systems. Systems you can count on. Systems that 
are constantly being reviewed and improved. Systems 
that are under one roof so you don't have to travel 
hither and yon piecing together something that might

'

or might not water your crops.
We can also provide you with every 

conceivable service, part or replacement part 
you’ll ever need.

So stop in and talk to us. We’ll make you a little 
wiser about irrigation systems. And who knows, 
maybe even a little wetter.

All we think about is water.
FOR SALE: 16" well casing, 
new steel 18" 2c a lb.; 6 and 
8" column pipe. Vi prices for 
junk iron.

FARWELL PIPE & IRON 
601 Ave. A 

Harwell, Texas
l5-46t-tfc

To obtain STANLEY HOME
PRODUCTS or profitable inde­
pendent dealerships write or 
call 247-3696. Ann Gee. 902 
Washington. Friona 
lS-10t-3tc

Party takes made and deco­
rated; Call 272 .3054.
15-101 4tp

i ALLMAX
IRRIG ATIO N S Y S T E M S

See your local authorized Alumax deafer at:

■j

A  -  - Phone 806/272-5533 
522 West American Bivd 
MULESHOE, TEXAS • 79347

SANDHILLS IRRIGATION
ZIMMATIC CENTER-PIVOT SYSTEMS

of three an 21 by 1980 - more 
than 450.000 children."
Child Find is a project of Texas 

Education Agency’s division of 
special education and is fi­
nanced by a grant from the U.S. 
Office of Education. Bureau of 
Education for the Handicapped.
“ Hope is what we're offering 

thousands of Texas youngsters, 
through the project called Child 
Find." Butler points out. If a 
child's needs cannot be met 
educationally. Child Find serves 
as a coordinator, matching a- 
vailable services and resources 
to the individual situation of the 
child. The Board chairman em­
phasized the program will not 
duplicate services of other pub­
lic agencies or private organiza­
tions. He said Child Find will act 
as a "catalyst", representing 
the child's best interests to 
appropriate organizations and 
communicating the availability

of special services to parents 
and guardians on a person-to- 
person basis.

A TTIN TI0 N  
M ULESHOE L I U  

CATTLEMEN
...In regard to dead stock 
removal . . .  If you have a 
problem with service . . . 
whether In the feed yard or 
on the farm . . . Please 
give US a chance! Thank You.

Y O U R  L O C A L  USED
COW DEALER IN

MULESHOE
Ph. 965-2903 
Mobil 965-2429
MbIbsI bb

B i - P  r « M b  ctx

PREVENTS WEEDS ̂

Foxtail Purslane Rescue Grass

FEEDS LAWNS in 1 Easy Step

ferti*lome.
WEED

AND
FEED 

SPECIAL
Ideal (or Bermuda 
gress and St. August­
ine lawns. Pj 0] V] Nj g  R)3 !

The Journals
Po l i t i ca l  Co lumn

^ ■ HE J

fa U K S A T ES ?  ’
Rate for listing in the Journal's Political Column is 

$35 for all offices except thos for city council and 
school board offices, which are $30. This fee includes 
a front page announcement article and a one-column 
photograph at the time the announcement is made, in 
addition to the listing in the Political Column from the 
date of the announcement until the final election.
Charges for announcements are cash in advance, 

and this same policy applies to all political advertising 
carried in the columns of this newspaper.

Names for each office will be listed in the Political 
Column in the order they are received at the 
newspaper office.
The Journal has been authorized to announce the 

following candidates for public office:

D I S T R I C T  A T T O R N E Y
Jack Young 

W. D o y l e  E l l i o t t  
B A I L E Y  C O U N T Y  C O M M I S S I O N E R

Robe r t  P. ( Bob)  Sanders  
Pr e c i nc t  No .  3 
James  W arren  

Preci nct  3
John W. Smi t h  

Pre c i nc t  1 
C. R . Black 

Pre c i nc t  1
W.  M. ( Mat t )  Dud l e y  

Pr e c i nc t  1
P A R M E R  C O U N T Y  C O M M I S S I O N E R

Ceci l  Atch ley 
Prec i nct  No .  3 

C O N S T A B L E  P R E C I N C T  1
Cl a u d e  D o n  Ho l me s  

John Bl a c kwe l l  
Bai l ey  Co u n t y  

S H E R R I E
Dee Cl e me n t s  

M A Y O R
C. H. Mi l l s ap  ( Ho me r )  

Ke n n e t h  H enry  
T E X  H O U S E  O F  R E P R E S E N T A T I V E S

Bill  Cl ayt on

A 41*, V
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T e x a n s  A t t e n d  N a t i o n a l  F a r m e r s  U
I he more prominent ones in- 
elude: United States Senator 
Hubert Humphrey, C hairman of 
the Congressional Joint Eeo- 
nomie Committee: Jack Ander­
son. author of the syndicated 
column “ Washington Merry- 
Go-Round": Robert Strauss. 
Chairman of the Democratic 
National Committee and Mary 
Louise Smith. Chairperson of 
the Republican National Com­

mittee; Jerry Twcdt, President 
of Farmers Union Central Ex­
change; Jewell Haaland. Chair­
man of the Board of Farmers 
Union Grain Terminal Associa­
tion; Dr. J. Robert Busche. 
Assistant executive director. Lu­
theran World Relief; and Dr. 
M.P. Cracknell. Secretary-Gen­
eral of the International Federa­
tion of Agricultural Producers.
Texas Farmers Union Prcsi-

A large delegation of Texans 
will attend the National Farmers 
Union convention at Branitt 
Place Hotel in New Orleans 
March l-t through lb. This will 
be the 74th annual convention of 
the nationwide general farm 
organization.

An array of nationally and 
internationally renow ned speak­
ers will be featured during the 
five-day convention. Some of

dent Jay Naman of Waco will 
serve as chairman of the Pro­
gram Committee that will sub­
mit resolutions to the delegates. 
Naman will also serve as the 
chairman of the cotton, rice, and 
peanut division during the com­
modity discussions. The entire 
convention w ill break dow n into 
farm commodity interests dur­
ing one afternoon of the conven­
tion.

Cirain farmers attending the 
convention w ill tour the Farmers 
Export Company at Ama. Loui­
siana. one of the largest grain 
export facilities on the Gulf 
Coast. Tours of the world fa­
mous New Orleans historical 
landmarks have also been 
planned.
The U.S. Postal Service will 

salute the American farmer

two year term. Ed Smith of 
North Dakota, the present vice 
president, has announced he 
will not be a candidate for 
re-election.
The voting delegates and alter­

nates from Texas are: Joe 
Montgomery of Abilene; Delbur 
Swanson of El C'ampo and Joe 
Rankin of Ralls. The first, 
second and third alternates

(luring a special ceremony at 
11:00 a m., March 15 at which 
time it will issue an embossed 
stamped envelope to commem­
orate agriculture. This will be a 
historic first for the national 
farm organization meeting.

I he delegates will elect a 
National Farmers Union presi­
dent and vice-president for a

respectively are: Jerry Warren 
of Gorman; Henry Harnly of 
Pampa and George Lee Streit of 
Electra.

Funeral services for Mrsi 
Kathleen Whittington Haga< 
man. 71, of Amarillo, who died 
Monday, were held Tuesday at 2 
p.m. at Borwcll Brothers Ivy 
Chapel with Dr. James R. 
Carroll, pastor of First Presby­
terian Church, officiating. 
Graveside services were held at 
II a.m. Wednesday at Ever­
green Cemetery at Ranger.

A resident of Amarillo for six 
years, Mrs. Hagaman was a 
member of the First Presbyteri­
an Church.
Survivors include her husband. 

Fred W.; two daughters, Mrs. 
Betty Hooper of Muleshoe and 
Mrs. Gary F.. Carpenter of 
Avery; two sons. C.O. Long of 
Dallas and Whit Hagaman of 
Madisonville; one brother, G.R. 
Whittington of Amarillo; 10 
grandchildren and two great 
grandchildren.

200 B O N U S  G U N N  BROS 
ST AM PS

Each Week For 12 Weeks
CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO

Sergeant Larry D. Trevathan. 
son of Mr and Mrs. Garvin 
Long, Rt. I, Morton, Texas, has 
graduated from the Tactical Air 
Command Noncommissioned 
Officer Leadership School at 
Cannon AFB, New Mexico.

The sergeant, who was trained 
in military management and 
supervision, is a weapons me­
chanic at Cannon.

The sergeant is a 1971 gradu­
ate of Three Way High School. 
Maple, Texas.
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Church Of Christ
James LeFan will speak in a 

series of meetings. March 14 
through 17 at the Muleshoe 
Church of Christ. 2205 West 
American Blvd.. at 10 a.m. and 
7:.10 p.m. weekdays and from 
9:30 a.m., 10:20 a.m. and b p.m. 
on Sunday.

LeFan was born February 17, 
1923 in Bailey. Texas. He 
attended ACC in 1940-44 with a 
major in Education and minor in 
Speech and Bible.

Married in November. 1944, he 
and his wife Jackie have three 
children; Mike, 30; Loris, 26; 
and Kevin 22.

He served as associate minis­
ter with P.D. Wilmeth of the 
Northside (now Jefferson) 
Church of Christ in San Antonio, 
Texas from 1944-4h. Upon leav­
ing San Antonio, the family 
moved to Baytown. Texas, 
where he served as the minister 
of the Missouri Street Church of 
Christ from 1946-50. He has 
worked with the Western Hills 
Church in Temple, Texas, for 25 
years, moving there in 1950.

He has contributed articles at 
various times to the following 
religious publications: 20th Cen­
tury Christian. Power for Today, 
Minister's Monthly, Teen-Age 
Christian, and has spoken at 
Pcpperdine College. Lubbock 
Christian College. Harding Col­
lege, Fort Worth Christian Col­
lege. David Lipscomb College, 
and Abilene Christian College 
Annual Lectureship Programs. 
He speaks often to civic groups 
and in six evangelistic meetings 
each year.

LeFan was past president of 
Lion's Crippled Children Foun­
dation, Inc.; past president of 
“ Bell County Society for Crip­
pled Children"; chairman. Leon 
Valley Chapter of the March of 
Dimes. He received special 
recognition from the governor of 
the State of Texas for his work in 
behalf of the mentally retarded.
The theme James LeFan has 

chosen for the gospel meeting is 
"By Christ Compelled." Also, 
in connection with this gospel 
meeting, the young people arc 
invited to hear "The Sunny 
Days" from LCC at the Mule- 
shoe Youth Rally. Sunday, 
March 14. from 1:30 - 7 p.m.

Activities include: group discus­
sions. speakers, singing, food, 
and fellowship. If transportation 
is needed call 272-3070.

STE AK
S I R L O I N

STE AK
T - B O N E

STEAK
R l l
S T E AK

R O A S T
C H U C K

ROA S T

W I S C O N S I N  L O N G H O R N  
R E D  R I N D  M A R K E T  C U T
C H E D D A R $139 ALL M E A T  S K I N L E S S.1 F R A N K S

IAMFS LFFAN

CHEESE
K R A F T S
S I N G L E  W R A P P E D
S L I C E D  1

WARRANTY DEEDS
R.D. Nix, et al to Calvin E. 

Lemmon. Trustee for the North­
western Mutual Life Insurance 
Company, of the south half of 
Section 15 and all of section 16. 
Block Y. W.D. and F.W. John­
son Subdivision.
From the estate of G.D. Ellis to 

Zenon Lopez and et ux all of 
Lots two and 17, Lot 22. Country- 
Club Addition.

Mrs. Era Mac Thorton Kinlev, 
et vir to Refugio F. Castorena 
and et ux. all Lots 10 and 11 in 
Block 44. Original Town of 
Muleshoe. Bailey County. Tex­
as. together with all improve­
ments there on but subject to 
existing casements and right-of- 
way.

Antonio P. Gutierrez and et ux 
to Trino and Alfredo Santos, all 
of Lots 14 and 15, in Block 3b. 
Original Town of Muleshoe. 
Bailey County, Texas.
C.A. Watson, et ux to Gene 

Snell, et al 13.4 acre Tract and 
9.77 acre Tract out of Section 81, 
Block Y.
Oleta M. Bruton and et vir to 

Christine Ozcll Higginbotham. 
Lot 19. Gatlin Addition.

$ - 0 9  v a c u m  p a c x e d  / & > $ |

J  B A C O N #  . !CHEESE
e u i e e t a #303 Can White Swan 

Cream Style Golden
#303 Can White Swan Cut24oz. Bottle Kraft Pure

S A F F L O W E R  O I L G R E E N  B E A N S
4 \ $ 1 0 0

C O R N
Parkay Soft 1 lb. Ctn 2-8oz. Tubs

l2oz. Box Nabisco

V A N I L L A  W A F E R S
18oz. Box

P O S T  T O A S T I E S
Grade A Small

32oz. Box Hungry Jack

P A N C A K E  M I X .
#303 Ja r Del Monte Sliced Sweet

P I C K L E D  BE E T S^POTATOES #303 Can White Swan Peeled

T O M A T O E S  .
32oz. Bottle 6 Bottle Ctn

C O C A - C O L A
21oz. Jar Win-You Cherry

PI E F I L L I N G
T E X A S  G A R D E N F R E S H

RADI SHE S “
T E X A S  Y E l l O W

S Q U A S H T A M A L E S
Giant Size Box

C H E E R  D E T E R G E N T
Miracle
Whip

MAJOR/MINOR
^TUNE-UP

Liquid King Size Bottle

GRAPEFRUIT C O M E T  C L E A N S E R

20oz. Pkg Westpac

S H O E S T R I N G  
P O T A T O E S ....................
Morning Star Farm Cholesterol Free

B R E A K F A S T .................
lOoz. Pkg Birdseye

P E A S  & C A R R O T S
Banquet

T . V .  D I N N E R S

We Welcome

USDA
F O O D  STAMP 
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C O M E  T O C A S H W A Y  
F O R  Y O U R  

W I C
C A R D  P U R C H A S E S

It pays you to keep vour car engine in 
top operating condition; r^t better 
mileage anti f ir  more dependability. 
When you have a major or a minor 
tune up you will pay less when you 
bring your car to us.

. ..EE ESTIMATES 
Phone 272-456 
South Main 
Mnlnskon

Listen To 
Ml LETRAIN
Over KMUl.

10:15 A.m. 
Sponsored By 
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