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H om estead Exem ption s C an R ed u ceT axes
TaxpayerMust Meet 
Basic Qualifications

r . t

Around J
*

i Muleshoe j
There will be a regular 

Board of Director’s meet­
ing in the Bailey County 
Farm Bureau office March 
9, 1982, Tuesday, at 7:30 
p.m. All members are urg­
ed to attend.

*•*
The Bailey County 

Grand Jury met Monday, 
March 1 and handed down 
three true bills. Two were 
indicted for theft and one 
was indicted for rape.

Civil jury trials are 
scheduled to be held on 
March 15.

***

The final sign-up date 
for joining the Muleshoe 
Square Dance lessons is 
Friday, March 5. Contact 
Joyce Brock, 272-3451 after 
6 p.m.

***

According to Henry Ho- 
nea of Sen. Bill Sarpalius’ 
office, there will be a hear­
ing of the Parks and Wild­
life Department regarding 
the hunting and fishing 
regulations on March 16 at 
2 p.m. in the Bailey County 
courthouse.

•#***
Word has been received 

from the Business Admin- - 
istration office at at the 
school that Sam Gonzales 
has filed for position on the 
school board in the up­
coming elections. Others 
who have filed include 
George Neiman, Gordon 
Wilson, Steve Neptune and 
Royce Harris. Deadline for 
filing is March 3. 1982.
Cont. Page 6, Col. 1
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Varsity All-Time 
Records Revealed

MULESHOE'S FINEST-Thh  Mile relay team from Muleshoe High won District and 
regional honors and went on to compete in state meets in 1938 for their alma mater. Shown 
1. to r. are: Martin Oliver, Claude Riley, Horace McAdams and Woody Lambert. (Photo 
courtesy of Claude Riley.)

City, County Receive Quarter 
Mixed Drink Share Rebates

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock reported Tuesday 
that the more than one and 
a quarter billion dollars 
worth of mixed drinks Tex­
ans bought during 1981 
netted $125 million in tax 
revenue for state and local 
governments last year.
. Bullock made the obser­

vation in returning more 
than $10 million in local 
share rebates of the 10 
percent gross receipts tax 
on mixed drinks to 383 
Texas cities and 209 count- 
for the fourth quarter of 
1981

Bailey County received 
$426.64 and the City of 
Muleshoe received $541.94

Cotton Trading Slows 
And Demand Weakens

Trading slowed and de­
mand weakened in Lub­
bock’s spot cotton market' 
during the week ended 
February 25, according to 
Mack Bennett, Area Direc­
tor for USDA’s Marketing 
Services Office at Lubbock.

Growers continued to 
enter cotton into Commod­
ity Credit’s Loan program. 
An estimated 1.2 million 
bales of High Plains cotton 
had entered as Form A, 
Form G or seed cotton by 
mid-week. Equity bids 
ranged from $4.00 to $8.00 
per bale but no trading was

reported, Bennett said.
U. S. textile mills used 

an average of 19,000 run­
ning bales of cotton per 
day during January, up 
from 15,800 per day in 
December. Mills used 
379,400 bales during the 
month of January bringing 
the August - January total 
to 2,576,000 or about 46 
percent of the estimated 
5.8 million net weight 
bales to be used during the 
1981 - 82 season.

High Plains growers sold 
mixed lots of mostly grades

Cont. Page 6, Col. 3

as their 15 percent of re­
bates.

In Castro County, 
$1,018.08 was received as 
a rebate, while in Dimmitt 
$805.31 was received, and 
Nazareth received $16.19.

In Cochran County, a 
total of $99.03 was rebated 
for,the fourth quarter per­
iod.

Deaf Smith County re­
ceived a rebate in the 
amount of $3,190.23, while 
the City of Hereford re­
ceived $3,006.84.

Lamb County received 
$1,282.49 rebate on mixed 
drinks tax while the City of 
Littlefield received $845.- 
.02.

Texas cities and counties 
receive a 15 percent rebate 
of the tax charged on 
mixed drinks sold within 
their boundaries.

The state will pocket 
more than $24.3 million 
from mixed drink taxes

Short Course 
Starts March 8

The upcoming Beef Pro­
duction Short Course for 
adult farmers will begin on 
March 8 and run through 
March 11. This course is 
being conducted by Dr, 
Elmer V. Krehbiel, Beef 
Production Specialist with 
the Agricultural Education 
Adult Specialist Program 
and the Department of 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 5

from the October, Novem­
ber and December period.

During 1981, the state’s 
share of mixed drink taxes 
totaled $88.7 million. City- 
county rebates totaled 
$36.3 million.

The tax, authorized by 
Con’t page 6 col. 2'

Some months ago, Head 
Track Coach Kevin Wise­
man made an appeal to 
area residents for informa­
tion regarding any records 
held by high school ath­
letes in Muleshoe High 
School for any year.

After running down 
much information and 
spending many hours go­
ing through old Journal 
files, Wiseman has come 
up with a varsity top ten 
performances in Muleshoe 
High School history.

These records will be 
used to make display 
boards in the high school 
and will be kept updated 
by year and by seasons. 
Coach Wiseman’s conten­
tion was that it might pi­
que the interest of current 
athletes to know what and 
who accomplished track 
and field events in the 
past.

While these records are 
in no way official, they re­
present the information 
th at has been submitted.

HOUSTON BOUND-FFA members and parents were treated to a breakfast early Monday 
morning by Progress Gin owner, Red Durham and Bill Harmon, of H & J Equipment 
Company. The breakfast was prepared and served in the high school ag building for those 
members leaving for Houston Livestock Show.

COOP DIRECTORS-]. W. Herrington and Joe Embry
were re-elected Saturday as Bailey County Electric Coop 
directors for the upcoming terms at the annual stockhol­
ders meeting.

Senior Services 
Officer Named

ruary 24 and 254. As a re­
sult, Melba Bratcher was 
employed and she assumed 
her duties March 1.

Her office is located in 
the courthouse and the 
hours are from 9:00 to 
12:00 a.m. and 1:00 to 4:00 
p.m. The phone number is 
272-3647. Senior Citizens 
who are in need of assis­
tance or information re­
garding services to which 
they may be entitled are 
invited to call her at the 
above number, or see her 
in the office during those 
hours.
Cont. Page 6, Col. 6

City Council 
Rap Session

Muleshoe City Council 
met Tuesday, March 2, for 
a regular meeting with all 
councilmen present.

Items for discussion in­
cluded the specifications 
for a new street sweeper 
that the city will be releas­
ing for bid.

Other items for consid-
«*

eration was the drilling and 
repair costs and needs for 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 3

As previously announc­
ed, the Information and 
Referral Services, relative 
to the SPAG Aging Prog­
ram, are being expanded, 
so as to be more compre­
hensive and reach areas 
not now being served.

In this connection, the 
Commissioners Court in­
terviewed applicants for 
the new position on Feb-

Former Local 
Boy At B oy’s
Ranch

A 17 year old Boy's 
Ranch student is one of 
seven high school students 
to hold state offices in the 
Vocational Occupation 
Clubs of Texas. George 
Jarvis, formerly of Mule­
shoe, is the Boy’s Ranch 
Club officer.

A
George lived in Mule­

shoe for a few years, stay­
ing with his aunt and 
uncle, Mr. and Mrs. Ra­
leigh Mason, who live in 
the West Camp area.

According to the Boy’s 
Ranch Bulletin, George has 
tieen taking plumbing for 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 6

Wiseman asks that anyone 
having information other 
than what is contained in 
this record, please contact 
him at the High School. Of 
special help to Coach 
Wiseman was Bill Taylor, 
current principal of Mary 
DeShazo. Taylor was track 
coach for the Muleshoe 
teams for several years and 
added much to Wiseman’s 
information.

The Men’s Varsity Top 
Ten Performances in 
Cont. Page 7 Col. 1

Tax relief for property 
owners is available to Tex­
as homeowners.

Dale Jones, chief ap­
praiser for the Bailey 
Appraisal District an­
nounced the availability of 
several residence home­
stead exemptions which 
can reduce the tax burden 
for homeowners who qual- 
ify.

A one-time application is 
required, and, if this ex­
emption was signed up for 
in 1981, it will not have to 
be repeated in 1982, due to 
early implementation of 
the Bailey County Apprai­
sal District.

CooperativeMeeting 
“Largest Ever”

The 1982 annual meeting 
of the Bailey Counmty El­
ectric Cooperative was held 
last Saturday, February 27 
in the Bailey County Civic 
Center.

Approximately 150 to 
175 persons were treated 
to a fish fry dinner, served 
and catered by Southern 
Seas of Lubbock. Atten­
dance was reported to be 
the highest ever.

Following the dinner, 
the annual business meet­
ing was held and Joe 
Embry and J. W. Herring­
ton were re-elected to 
upcoming terms.

Nominations were taken 
from the floor for two per­
sons from districts 4, 5 and 
7 for the 1983 nominating 
committee. One person 
was elected to serve in an 
at-large capacity. Those 
elected were District 4 - 
Delbert Watson and Wiley 
Moore; District 5 - Dee 
Tucker and Earnest Tuck­
er; District 7-Ray O’Brian 
and J. E. Clampitt. Com- 
mitteeman-at-large, J. F. 
Ferguson.

Special guests were Lyle 
Robinson of Swisher Coun­
ty Electric; Magann Ren- 
nels and Gil Lamb, Gerald 
Reid, Jim Lincoln, Bob 
Finney, Paul Cox, Ted 
Barnhill, C. Ray Lynk, Jeff 
Rhodes, Lynette Shafer, J. 
G. Wilson and Velma Wil­
liams.

Coop managger, Connie 
Gupton gave a re-port on 
the upcoming hike in rates 
due to the service contract

Schools Host 
Open House

Harold Horne, superin­
tendent of the Muleshoe 
Schools, announces that 
the Junior High and High 
School will observe Texas 
Public School Week 
March 1-6 by hosting Open 
House on Thursday even­
ing, March 4 from 7-9 p.m.

Fred Mardis, principal of 
the Junior High invites 
everyone to attend the an­
nual Science Fair and His­
tory Fair and view the pro­
jects made by the students 
in grades 6, 7 and 8.

Mr. Ethridge also invites 
parents and citizens to visit 
the Muleshoe High School 
and talk with teachers re­
lative to students work.

The elementary schools 
had Open Houses during 
American Education Week 
in November.

with Southwestern Public 
Service which ends in 
August.

Drawkings for door priz­
es were made, as well as 
for the grand prize. Kem 
Bales won the Hotpoint 
Microwave oven as the 
grand prize.

Other prize winners in­
clude W. B. Merritt, D. L. 
Redwine, Ernest Ramm, 
W. C. McCelvey, R. T. 
Atchison, I. L. Kitchens, 
Melvern West and A. H. 
Herman.

Also taking home prizes 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 4

Homesteads must meet 
the following qualifications 
(1) the home must be 
owned by the person (s) 
claiming the exemption; (2) 
the home must be design­
ed or adapted for human 
residence; (3) the home 
must actually be used as a 
residence; and (4) the 
home must be occupied as 
the principal residence of 
an owner who qualified for 
the exemption.

A residence homestead 
is a structure, together 
with the land and improve­
ments, which are used for 
residential purposes.

Mobile homes, if they 
meet the qualifications, 
can be claimed as home­
steads even if they are on 
leased land.

“ A taxpayer can still 
qualify for the exemptions 
even if a portion of his 
residence is used for other 
purposes, such as a busi­
ness in the home,” Jones 
said. “ Additionally, a 
homeowner will not lose 
the exemption if he tem­
porarily moves away, pro­
vided that he INTENDS TO 
RETURN and does not 
claim a homestead else­
where.”

Various types of home­
stead exemptions exist. 
Applications for any must 
be filed with the chief 
appraiser after January 1

Con’t page 6 col. 2

Cotton Council Objects 
To Weather Ban

The National Cotton 
Council has raised a strong 
objection to the National 
Weather Service’s propos­
ed elimination of its agri­
cultural weather program 
in fiscal 1983.

The proposal is included 
in the agency’s budget re- 
commendatiions now being 
considered by a House 
Science and Technology 
subcommittee chaired by 
Rep. James H. Scheuer 
(D-N.Y.).

Council Presient Ed­
ward Breihan of Lubbock, 
Texas, in a letter to the 
subcommittee chairman 
this week, described the 
program as “ highly val­

uable” to farmers as well 
as consumers.

“ It saves farmers hun­
dreds of millions of dollars 
each year,” Breihan stat­
ed, “ and also means un­
told additional savings to 
consumers in terms of in­
creased production lower- 
prices.”

Breihan cited a 1978 
study which showed that 
the availability of timely 
weather information meant 
a potential 16 percent sav­
ings in cotton-growing 
costs in Mississippi. In 19- 
81, he noted, this amount­
ed to nearly $57 million in 
savings for only one crop in

Cont. Page 6, Col. 4

RECORD 5F7TE7?-Woody Lambert of Muleshoe Jfigh
School set a record for the 880 in 1938 which held until 
1948. This was a district record. Lambert was also a 
member of the mile relay team which won district, 
regional and then went to state meets. (Photo courtesy of 
Claude Riley.)
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Wrinkle
Services Pending

Eby Services 
Held Thursday

children; and three great­
grandchildren.

Services for Vanita F. 
Eby, 62, were held at 2 
p.m. today, Thursday, 
March 4, at the Ellis Cha­
pel of the Chimes with 
Rev. James Williams, pas­
tor of the Calvary Baptist 
Church, officiating.

Interment was in Bailey 
County Memorial Park un­
der the direction of Ellis 
Funeral Home. Mrs. Eby 
died at 2:25 p.m. Tuesday 
in West Plains Medical 
Center.

She was born August 26, 
1919 in Durham, Kansas 
and moved to Muleshoe in 
1978 from Lovington, N.M. 
She was a retired LVN 
nurse, working for the the 
Farwell Convalescent Cen­
ter and the Muleshoe Nur­
sing Home.

Mrs. Eby graduated 
from McPherson School of 
Nursing, with an LVN de­
gree in 1974, at McPherson 
Kansas. She was a mem­
ber of the First United 
Methodist Church of Her- 
ington, Kansas.

Survivors include one 
daughter, Mrs. Eula Faye 
Ratliff of Muleshoe; one 
brother, Norman Kerns of 
Salina, Kansas; grand-

MRS. VANITA EBY

Scanning 
Social Security

ON INFLATION
Despite a sizable surge in 

food costs, overall wholesale 
prices barely edged up last 
month, by an annual rate of 
5.3 percent, the government 
said recently. Treasury Sec­
retary Donald Regan called it 
“ a strong signal that 
inflati >n is going to stay 
down.”

At Levelland
Services for Dennis Tip- 

ton Wrinkle, Jr. 56, of 
Levelland, are pending at 
George C. Price Funeral 
Home Directors in Level- 
land.

Wrinkle was pronounced 
dead at 8:30 a.m. Tuesday

at his home>
The Cooke County native 

moved from Tulia to Level- 
land in 1964. He was a 
member of the Levelland 
Police Department from 
1964 to 1979, and attained 
rank of sergeant. At the 
time of his death, he was 
employed by Hockley 
County as a heavy equip­
ment operator.

Wrinkle was a World 
War 11 Navy veteran and a

member of the Levelland 
Veterans of Foreign Wars 
Post.

He was a baptist.
Survivors include his 

wife, Joyce; his mother, 
Minnie Wrinkle of Bronte; 
a daughter, Karen Simp­
son of Levelland; a son, 
Jerry Lynn, stationed with 
the U. S. Navy in Guam; 
three sisters, Lora Belle 
Tennyson, Leola Hughes of 
Bronte and Evelyn Rip-

petoe of Gorman; a brother 
Roy of Muleshoe and five 
grandchildren.

Golden G leam s

I want to be an angel, 
And with the angels 

stand,
A crown upon my fore­

head,
A harp within my hand.

-Urania Bailey.

BIBLE VERSE
”Come ye after me, 

and I will make you to 
become fishers o f men. "

1. Where is this verse 
found in the Bible?
2. To whom was it 
spoken?
3. By whom was it 
spoken?
4. Is the invitation record­
ed elsewhere in the Bible?

Au v m  to Bible Vene
•‘a

1. Matthew 4:19b.
2. To Simon and Andrew, 
who were fishing.
3. By Jesus.
4. Mark 1:17.

Thou hast the sweetest 
face I ever looked on; 

Sir, as I have a soul, she 
is an angel.

-Shakespeare.

If you receive Social Se­
curity disability checks, re- • 
member that these pay­
ments can be made only 
for as long as your medical 
condition is considered to 
be disabling under the law. 
Under a change in the law, 
most disability cases will 
be reviewed periodically to 
make sure requirements 
are still met.

Some beneficiaries who 
want to try to work even 
through still disabled are 
aided by certain provisions 
in the law. One allows full 
benefits to be paid during 
a nine month trial work 
period. Another allows 
many impairment-related 
work expenses to be de­
ducted from earnings. Also 
Medicare can continue for 
up to three years if bene­
fits stop due to work, and 
payments can quickly be 
restarted if the work at­
tempt fails within a year 
after the last benefit check.

If you are a disabled 
beneficiary whose case 
comes up for review, you 
may be asked for infor­
mation about your condi­
tion or for help in getting a 
recent medical report. Or 
you may be asked to take a 
special examination or test 
at Government expense. It 
is important that you co­
operate fully if contacted.

After the review has 
been completed, you will 
receive a written notice of 
the decision made in your 
case. If your payments will 
end, you will first have an 
opportunity to submit, 
within ten days, any new 
information or evidence 
you feel should be con­
sidered. You also have a 
right"to request, within 60 
days after receiving a no­
tice you disagree with, a 
formal reconsideration. 
You can find out more 
about this at any Social 
Security office.

W H ITE'S  C A S H W A Y
SUPERMARKET

MULESHOE, TEXAS .
Double Gunn Bros. Stamps Every Wednesday A Saturday fiI  

O p e n  M o n d a y - S a t u r d a y  7 :3 0  A .M . t o  8 :0 0  P .M . U  
S u n d a y  1 2 :0 0  P .M . t o  8 :0 0  P .M . ^

WE WELCOME WIC CARDS & USDA FOOD STAM PS

COUNTRY HEARTH

BUTTERMILK BREAD I h LOAF

FULL CUT
R O U N D

U.S.DJL CHOKE BEEF 
BONE IN

STEAK 199
BONELESS

R O U N D  ST E A K
FULL CUT

BONELESS 
SIMOIN

ST E A K

s2 «

RUMP

R O A S T
BONELESS



\
Muleshoe Journal. Muleshoe, Texas. Thursday. March 4. 198Jy Page 3

B r o w n  T o  A w a r d  

C o t t o n  B a le  
O n  A g - D a y

A l)STIN -lf you would 
like to have a bale of cotton all 
your own (or the possible 
S240 it’s worth), Agriculture 
Commissioner Reagan V. 
Brown will be giving one away 
March 18 as pan of the state's 
observance of Agriculture 
Day.

Brown is the state chairman 
of A griculture Day, a 
nationwide recognition of the 
contribution of agriculture to 
the U. S. economy. The theme 
for this state is “Agriculture- 
It’s Your Heanbcat, Texas."

The Lam esa C o tto n  
Growers A ssociation is 
donating the 480-pound bale.
The average price of cotton 
today, depending on grade, is 
about 50 cents per pound.

“ Persons interested in 
becoming instant cotton 
farmers will have to do some 
work. They are required to 
write a postcard full of

reasons why agriculture is 
important to Texas," Brown 
said.

“The Lamesa growers will 
get the bale to the Capitol, but 
the winner will be responsible 
for transporting it from there, 
storing it and finding a 
buyer,” Brown said.

“The winner will be facing 
the same challenge that 
farmers have now in finding 
the buyer with the best price. 
We’ll give some suggestions, 
but the owner will handle all 
of the negotiations for sale.”

<M

I

'.I

COUNTY MEET TEAM-This MHS Relay team was the team sent to the county meet in 
1938. Team members include (I to r) back row, Leamon Carpenter, Randy Johnson, Woody 
Lambert and Martin Oliver. Front row, left to right: Claude Riley, Don Moore, Johnny 
Starkey, Horace McAdams and Red Harris. Harris was a top hurdler and went to state 
meets in 1939 in the hurdle event. (Photo courtesy of Claude Riley.)

RELAY TEAM MEMBER~C\aude Riley was also a 
member of the MHS Mile Relay team in 1938. He was the 
third member of the team that went to state meet in 1938. 
(Photo Courtesy of Claude Riley.)

A v a i l a b l e  M o n e y  S h o u l d  

H e l p  T e x a s  F a r m e r s
AUSTIN-Investment of 

bond sale returns in the Texas 
Family Farm and Ranch 
Loan Security Program is 
growing and should help 
beginning farmers get started 
when the program is initiated 
next year.

Agriculture Commissioner 
Reagan V. Brown announced 
that the investment of the S10

n v  THE 
CANDIDATES I  

OF YOUR CHOICE)
Rates for listing in the Journal’s Political Column is: 

$35 for all offices except those for City Council and 
School Board post which is $15. This fee includes a front 
page announcement article and a one column photo­
graph at the time the announcement is made, in 
addition to the listing in the Political column from the 
date of announcement until the final election.

Charges for announcements are cash in advance, and 
this same policy to applies to all political advertising 
carried in the columns of this newspaper.

Names for each office will be listed in the Political 
Column in the order they are received at the newspaper 
office.

The Journal has been authorized to announce the 
following candidates for public office:

Democratic
* County Clerk *

Barbara McCamish
* District Clerk *
Nelda Merriott

* County Treasurer * 
Dorothy Turner
* Tax Assessor *
Kathleen Hayes

* Justice O f Peace *
Precinct INo.l
Tana Holmes 
Jack Bates

* County Comm issioner » 
Precinct No. 4 

Rudolph Mo raw 
Frankie Dee Fine 

< Dale Middlebrooks 
Pete Hurtado

*287th Judicial District Judge ♦

Bailey & Parmer Counties 
Jack D. Young

» County Judge ♦ 
Gordon H. (Corky! Green

♦Com m issioner * 
Precinct No. 2 

Glen Dalton Harris 
Roy Whitt 
Don Seales

William Carl Patterson 
Charles Glover

Republican
* County Treasurer ♦

Jean Treadwell

♦ County Attorney ♦ 
Lamar Dee Treadwell
♦ County Judge * 
Thomas S. Freeman

♦ Justice o f Peace *
Precinct 1 

Paulette Cuevas

J v n . lEstaMUteH Frbniam 23 1924 Publtxhrd by M«te«ho* 
PvMiahtng Co.. Inc. Every Thurwlny at .104 W Second. 
Box 449. Mwlrihne. Teau. 79347. data Pmla|t
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SPECIALTY /?i/MV£7?~Martin Oliver, who was a member 
of the Muleshoe High School Mile Relay team in 1938 
also specialized in the 440. He set a record in 1938 at 
district meets which held for 15 years. (Photo Courtesy of 
Claude Riley.)

million from bond sales has 
increased by more than 
$80,000 after interest pay­
ments were made on the state 
loan.

“As of January 31,1982, we 
have $7,990,027 in tax- 
exempt bonds at 11.5 percent 
and $1.5 million invested by 
the State Treasurer at around 
13 percent, depending on 
fluctuations in the national 
rate. The balance is in certi­
ficates of deposit at various 
institutions.” Brown said.

He explained that arbitrage 
laws governing such state 
handling of bond money have 
limited the amount of interest

LP-Gas Cars 
Licensing
Explained

Inquiries by Texas auto­
mobile dealerships prepar­
ing to market propane po­
wered automobiles have 
prompted the Railroad 
Commission to explain li­
censing requirements for 
the said and Service of the 
vehicles.

Hugh Keepers, Director 
of the Commission’s Liq­
uefied Petroleum Gas Div­
ision, explained the re­
quirements to representa­
tives of the Texas Auto­
mobile Dealers Association 
today. Keepers says he 
expects to explain licensing 
of prepane automobiles 
other groups as the cars 
become increasingly avail­
able to Texas dealers 
through manufacturers. 
Ford motor company has 
notified dealers in Texas 
that factory equipped 
propane powered vehicles 
will be available to fleet 
customers during the 1982 
model year.

No license is required to 
sell, service or repair fact­
ory equipped lp-gas veh­
icles. A lp-gas license will 
be required to sell lp- gas 
containers or lp-gas carb- 
uretion systems. A license 
will also be required to 
install or replace the cont­
ainers or carburetion sys­
tems. The conversion of a 
vehicle to lp-gas including 
dual fuel carburetion sys­
tems requires a license.

Employees involved in 
installation or conversion 
of lp-gas systems must 
complete examinations re­
quired by the Railroad 
Commission to show their 
competence and knowledge 
of safety factors when 
dealing with lp-gas.

Safety is the Comm­
ission's primary concern 
when requiring a license to 
work with lp-gas, Keepers 
said.

that can be earned. Certain 
funds have to be kept liquid to 
pay »he interest charges on the 
original issue of $10 million in 
bonds to begin the fund.

Brown introduced the 
program and lead the passage 
in the Legislature. “The 
program still has not cost tax­
payers any money. Interest 
has made payments on the 
loan,” he said.

The program is guided by a 
statewide advisory board 
appointed by the Governor.

The Senate Subcommittee 
on Agriculture, chaired by 
Senator Bill Sarpalius, has 
held a series of hearings 
around the state this year on 
ways to improve the program. 
Senators Carlos Truan and 
John Wilson are members of 
the committee. The final hear­
ing will be in July. “When

their riport is submitted, we 
will act on suggestions that 
will make it an even better 
program," Brown said.

The farm and ranch loan 
security program was passed 
through a constitutional 
amendment to help beginning 
farmers purchase land for 
growing crops or raising live­
stock. However, since its 
enactment, high interest rates 
have prevailed, and no appli­
cations were received by the 
Texas Department of Agri­
culture in the first year.

There are provisions in the 
bill for payment adjustments 
for each of the first lOyearsof 
a loan, by which the state 
would pay four percent of the 
year's outstanding balance. 
The purchaser would repay 
the state at six percent 
interest, beginning with the

eleventh year.
"This adjustment would 

probably have encouraged 
farmers to buy land despite 
the interest rate. However, 
funding was not incorporated 
for the adjustments in the 
original bill, and arbitrage 
laws prevented the use of 
interest for that purpose.” 

The Legislature asked 
Brown to place a moratorium 
on the p rogram  until 
September I, 1983, in order to 
build a fund for this type of 
adjustment. Until then, appli­
cations will not be accepted.

“ We hope th a t by 
September 1983 interest rates 
will be down to more attrac­
tive levels, and beginning 
farmers can take advantage of 
this very fine program," 
Brown said.

Vital Statistic
“ Where did I come 

from?" asked the little rose­
bud.

“ Why, the stalk brought 
you,” answered the rose.

ONE MINUTE SPORTS QUIZ

1. Who won the Daytona 500 
stock car race?
2. Who won the Hawaiian 
Open golf tournament?
3. Bowie Kuhn is commis­
sioner of what sport?
4. Who won the LPGA S & H 
tournament?
5. Who won the Sugar Ray 
Leonard, Bruce Finch bout?
Answers To Sport Quit

1. Bobby Allison.
2. Wayne Levi.
3. Baseball.
4. Hollie Stacy.
5. Sugar Ray Leonard.

Donald Regan, Treasury 
Secretary, on recent 
inflation report:
"The wholesale report 

should serve to strength­
en the backbone of some 
of my Wall Street friends 
who have been skeptical 
about the drop in infla­
tion.”

^ M E E T 'V
^ ★ T H E *  y *
CANDIDATES v  I
Parmer
County

Democratic

Commissioner
Precinct i

Raymond
McGehee
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HEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF

BONELESS 
CHUCK ROAST

MEAT SPECIALS
HEAVY GRAIN FED SELF BONELESS

CHUCK STEAK
S g 2 9

LIQUID DOWNY 
$ 0 9 9

DAIRY AND FROZEN FOODS

360*Bn

KJLGER'S

FLAKED COFFEE 
$ 2 0 9

BQROEN ASSTO SHERBf T OR

ICE CREAM
BOROLN CREAMY A ,

BUTTERMILK,^ 9 9 *
ASSORTED FLAVORS M k  A

K raft D ip s  sss Q a
13 OZ 
CAN

SIX STCK WHIPPED

K raft Pa r k a y
MRS. PAIX S RSH STICKS OR

FILLETS
RABY RUTH OR

f t S l & a ^ B U T T E R F IN G E R R ____

C andy  Bars.
sh u f ih n e  ifozen

HONEY BUNS

9l
VINE RIPE

.  FRESH 
■TOMATOES

LB

kai
GRAPEFRUIT 
TANGERINES 
CARROTSssr*

B I S C U I T S  a s ? 94

in BO.' $ iCANS 1
T A B L E T S ^ * * 34 CT BTl S ']  79

T o o t h b r u s h ^  vlu EACH B 9 ‘
T o o t h p a s t e s 1̂ 460ZTUBE S ']  19

S I G N A L 13 OZ BTl 2 9

P l N E A P P L E ^ ' ^ 9l5V*02 Km CANS 9 9 *
P E A R S & s ? ™ 16 OZ CAN 5 9 *
P I C K L E S ^ ; , JAR 9 8 *
P E P P E R S & r ™ 11*02SIZE 8 3 *
P R U N E S  » Tf 13 OZ PKG 9 8 *
C O F F E E & s r 118CAN * 2 3 9
C R Y S T A L S ^ " 5"5**' 10 OZ JAR $ 3 8 9
D  n  IM 1 “MFHCAN 0f AUTV 2 8 9 *
D e t e r g e n t giantSITE S ']  9 9

NICE S  SOFT

BATH TISSUE 
S ']  49

6 ROLL 
PKG

NICE & s o n

FACIAL TISSUE

BLUE WHITE GOLO BROWN

NEW!
"y- SOFT SOAP

FOP WORKING HANOS

NEW!
»WORK SOAP

l
10- OFF LABEL/w K F .xjjfIVORY

£s o a p 3 BATH 
BAR PKG 6 9

INB0W BREAD
COUNTRY HEARTH BUTTERMILK 69 10AF
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MR. AND MRS. KENNETH ELLIOTT 
[nee DaOnda Arnold]

‘Cliffhanger’ Announced 
By Six Flags Over Texas

The world’s first total 
freefall ride, the Texas 
Cliffhanger, will debut late 
this spring at Six Flags 
Over Texas.

The Arlington theme 
park’s general manager, 
Ray Williams, said the 
towering, 2.1 million dollar 
ride will give thrillseekers 
"the same falling sensa­
tion they would feel if they 
stepped of the top of a 
nine-story building.”

Williams said the ride 
has no precedent in the 
industry. “ Even our loop 
coaster,” he said, "had 
‘ancestors’ that were built 
around the turn of the cen­
tury, but there’s nothing in 
amusement ride history 
which resembles the Texas 
Cliffhanger.”

Williams, who recently 
rode the prototype model 
of the ride at the Intamin 
AG factory near Geneva, 
Switzerland, said, “The 
sensation is unlike any­
thing developed up to now. 
There’s no way to compare

it to even the biggest of 
roller coasters, or any ex­
isting ride.”

The ” L-shaped” ride to­
wer juts 128 feet into the 
air. Passengers board the 
Texas Cliffhanger on the 
underside of the tower. 
They will be seated four 
abreast in sleek, padded 
gondolas. The gondolas 
rise one at a time to the top 
of the tower, with the trip 
up taking only ten seconds.

At the top, the gondolas 
move into “ drop position” 
and will be held at that 
point for ten seconds. Ri­
ders. protected by over-the 
shoulder “ lap bars,” have 
an unobstructed view of 
the area in front of th^m.

After the pause, the gon­
dolas — weighing 1,500 
pounds without passengers 
-  drop at freefall speed, 
guided by tracks.

Near the bottom of the 
drop, the track curves and 
riders will suddenly find 
themselves on their backs 
looking straight up at the 
sky.

A computer controlled 
braking system will stop 
the gondolas near the end 
of an 86-foot long hori­
zontal track. Then the gon­
dolas will be slowly turned

upright and lowered to the 
bottom of the structure for 
unloading.

During the freefall drop, 
riders will experience a 3.5 
G force. The ride acceler­
ates from zero to 55 miles 
per hour in the first 1.3 
seconds of the plunge.

Williams said the com­
puter safety systems en­
gineered into the ride are

state of art” devices.
He said 103 electronic 

sensors send messages to 
the computer during each 
ride cycle.

Some of the sensors de­
tect the ride’s speed. Oth­
ers give the computer in­
formation on the exact lo­
cation of each gondola.

“ If the computer isn’t 
satisfied with the ride’s 
operation, it will temporar­
ily close it down/' Wil­
liams commented.

Williams said the ride is 
currently on its way by 
ship from Europe to Texas. 
Foundations for the 110- 
ton structure have already 
been poured.

After construction is 
completed, extensive tests 
will be conducted before 
the ride is opened to the 
public in late April.

The Texas Cliffhanger 
will occupy a site on the 
edge of Six Flags’ Boom- 
town section.

Gospel Meeting
Muleshoe Church 

Of Christ
21st & American Blvd. /

March 7-10,1982 
Sunday-

Bible Classes 9:30a.m!
Worship

10:20 a.m.-6 p.m.
Monday - Wednesday 

7:30 p.m.

Sunday, 10:20 a.m. 

Sunday, 6:00 p.m. 

Monday, 7:30 p.m. 

Tuesday, 7:30 p.m.

“Remember My Death ”
“Victory In Jesus ”
“What Is A Christian ” 

Stealing The Masters Cup”

Wednesday, 7:30 p.m. “Dost Thou Not Fear God?”

Everyone Cordially Welcome

9Jk)me Ce/temony -̂Unites 
u U i s s  S d t a

Miss DaOnda Arnold of 
Pawnee, Okla. became the 
bride of Kenneth Elliott, 
also of Pawnee, at 6 p.m. 
Monday, March 1, in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Dee 
Clements, grandparents of 
the bride. David Cox, min­
ister of the Muleshoe 
Church of Christ, read the 
marriage vows.

The bride is the daugh­
ter of Charles Arnold of 
Pawnee, and the late 
Wanda Joyce Clements 
Arnold.

Vows were repeated be­
fore two candelabras.

Given in marriage by her 
grandfather, the bride 
wore a winter white lace 
formal length gown featur­
ing a gored skirt, which 
consisted of three kinds of 
lace, one which matched 
the bodice. She carried a 
cascading bouquet of mix­
ed spring flowers.

Mrs. Ruth Clements, 
grandmother of the bride, 
served as matron of honor.

Candlelighters were Da­
rin and Damon Clements, 
cousins of the bride, of 
Lubbock.

Following the ceremony, 
a reception was held, also 
in the Clements’ home. 
The serving table was cov­
ered with a white lace cloth 
and accented with a basket 
of spring colored flowers. 
The two tiered wedding 
cake was topped with a 
bride and groom.

Zanna and Holly Hucka- 
by served cake, frozen ba­
nana punch, nuts and 
mints. I inda Huckaby was 
also a member of the house 
party.

The couple will make 
their home in Perkins, 
Okla. where the groom is a 
Volkswagen mechanic.

1942
MULESHOE MARKETS 
Prices for grains and 

produce by Muleshoe buy­
ers are as of Wednesday of 
this week: Maize, 72 cents; 
Wheat $1.05; Kaffir, 70 
cents; Cane, 50 cents; Su­
dan, 90 cents; Millet, $1.20 
and hogs cwt. $12.50.

Local grocery stores ad­
vertised items include: '/a 
pound of Hershey’s cocoa, 
£ cents; 2-pound box of 
crackers, l i  vents; coffee, 
1-pound. T5 cents; Flour, 
24 pound bag, 87 cents; 
Chili, 1-pound block, 19 
cents; Creamery butter, 1- 
pound, 37 cents; pink sal­
mon, 20 cents a can; and 
apple butter, 24 ounce, 2 
for 25 cents.

1952

The Epsilon Sigma Al­
pha Sorority met in the 
home of Maurine Hooten 
Tuesday night.

Zed Robinson is visiting 
in Los Angeles, California.

1972
Mr. and Mrs. Royce 

Turner and Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Poynor returned on 
Monday from a week’s trip 
to the Hawaiian Islands.

The annual Fireman's 
Ball will be held Saturday 
night, March 4, from 9:30 
till 1:30 a.m. at the Am­
erican Legion Hall.

Judy Winn was selected 
to play in the High School 
All-Star game in Amarillo 
onfcMarch 25.

Pointers 
for

/PARENTS
What’s the well-dressed 

infant wearing these days? 
Many may be seen in cus­
tom, handpainted, personal­
ized diaper sets.

Charming, comfortable, 
all-cotton terry diaper sets 
are available for girls or 
boys. They come in sizes 
12 months, 18 months and 
24 months and in tie-dyed 
blue, yellow or pink.

Advertised in the class­
ified section: Three bed­
room home on pavement, 
near high school, just been 
newly decorated, $6500.

Nice two bedroom home 
in Lenau Addition $9,000.

179 acres, four room 
house on pavement, Vi 
mineral, $75 per acre.

Apartment across street 
from hospital $35 per 
month, bills paid.

A Firestone dealer ad­
vertised the following i- 
tems: Portable sewing ma­
chine, $75; 12 month new 
battery, $6.49 and mixer 
with juicer, $33.95.

1962

Mrs. Horace Blackburn 
was presented a plaque 
"Teacher of the Year” in 
Muleshoe at a reception 
last Sunday. Gil Lamb of 
Station KMUL made the 
presentation remarking, 
“ From one Muletrain 
Sponsor to another."

From top to bottom, 
baby can be at the height of 
fashion in a personalized 
diaper set.

The girl’s set features a 
pretty, smiling face, three 
flowers, bedecked with 
rhinestones, and a big bow 
on the shirt;sweet and sassy 
hearts on the pants.

The boy’s set has a ham­
mer on the pants, assorted 
tools on the top. Each can 
have the child’s name above 
all.

Proud parents, grand­
parents and other friends 
and relatives who wish to 
set up an infant in such 
sets can send $23.95 to 
Wryte-On, Inc., P. O. Box 
393, Commack, N.Y. 11725. 
Send the name and first 
and second choice of colors 
and allow three weeks for 
delivery.

“Ti

The first bank to be open 
day and night was the 
Night and Day Bank, New 
York City, opened May 1 
1906
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MR. AND MRS. RODGER CLYNBUHRMAN 
[nee Peggy June Carter]

C: From Journal Files .’3r.-------------- -----------y

Harmon Elliott 
Speaker At 
AARP Meeting

The AARP met Friday, 
February 26, at the recre­
ation room of the Harmon 
Elliott Complex, with 37 
present for a covered dish 
luncheon.

Myrtle Creamer, presi­
dent, called the meeting to 
order. Lena Hawkins led 
the pledge to the flag and 
Clarence Wilhite gave the 
invocation.

Mrs. John Gunter intro­
duced the guest speaker, 
Harmon Elliott. “ He gave 
an informative talk, which 
was appreciated by every­
one,’’says Ivy Wall, AARP 
reporter.

Minutes of the previous 
meeting were read and ap­
proved.

Zed Robinson led the 
birthday song for those 
celebrating birthdays this 
month.

Iva Smith will send cards 
to those on the sick list.

Thos present included;
» -Mr. and Mrs. F. H. DDav- 

vis, Bob and Nola McDan­

iel, Zed and Maude Rob­
inson, Lee and Jewel Pool, 
Harmon Elliott, Clarence 
and Lida Wilhite, John and 
Lela Gunter, Ernest and 
Jewell McNatt. Earlton
and Ivy Wall, Mrs. Leo­
nard Evans, Mrs. Ira Smith 
Jane Williams, Myrtle
Chambless, Faye Lambert, 
Mae Adkins, Hazel Reeder 
Riddle, Mary B. Oben-
haus, Lena Hawkins, Jewel 
Green, Blanche Autrey.i
Jewell Strong, Dot Marie 
Parker, Clara Lou Jones, 
Myrtle Creamer, Mary 
Farley, Amber Reid, Doc 
Goucher and D. J. Gage.

Two new members join­
ed AARP. Jewell Green 
and Mary B. Obenhaus.

The next meeting will be 
at the Civic Center on the 
regular date, March 26, 
at 11:30 a.m. A covered 
dish luncheon will be ser­
ved.

The group was dismiss­
ed following the benedic­
tion by Doc Goucher.

Too Generous 
Most people who hand 

out small talk seem to 
think it must be done in 
large quantities.

-Eagle, Dothan, Ala.

u W i s s  C o f t t o .  

£ycJ ia«ge QJouis
Peggy Jane Carter be­

came the bride of Rodger 
Clyn Buhrman at 6 p.m. 
February 6 in the com­
munity chapel at Red Riv­
er, N.M. The Rev. Jerry 
Smith officiated.

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Ray 
Carter and Mr. and Mrs.
Kline Buhrman.

Honor attendants were
Paula Williams, sister of 
the bride and Curtis Buhr­
man, brother of the groom.

Family and friends were 
present for the wedding 
and reception.

The bride and groom are 
both graduates of Mule­
shoe High School. The 
bride graduated from 
Amarillo Junior College 
and Buhrman graduated 
from Texas Tech Univer­
sity.

RECIPE
By Sank hntte SherMio

Tossed Apple Salad

2 raw apples, unpeeled
2 peeled oranges

V* c peanuts, chopped
2 t minced onions
2 c finely shredded 

green cabbage
V. c French dressing

Cut apples into small 
wedges. Separate oranges 
into sections. Combine with 
peanuts, onion and cabbage. 
Just before serving add 
French dressing and toss 
well.

Bean Pot Applesauce

Apples 
Brown sugar

Peel and quarter enough 
apples to fill a bean pot. Roll 
each apple quarter in brown 
sugar and add enough water 
to keep apples from sticking, 
(about V* cup). Cover and 
bake at 325 degrees for 
several hours or until apples 
are tender and mushy. Serve ' 
with pork or duck, or as a 
dessert served with cream.

d id  y o u  
k n o w ?

The average SPS customer spends the same 
percentage of his budget for electricity as he 
did in 1976. SPS keeps electric service costs 
lower by engineering and designing its own 
power plants, cooling towers and certain 
pollution-control devices. SPS is continuing 
its research into alternative energy sources to 
guarantee that our customers will have a 
reliable supply of electric power.

/im Martin, district manager. Clovis.

SPS employees pay the same rate for electric service as do the 
Company's other customers. Although some utility companies 
in other areas offer special employee rates, SPS employees do 
not receive a discount on their electric service.

lim Steinhilper, senior rate analyst, Amarillo.

SPS must build new power plants to take ad­
vantage of coal, a more reliable, less expen­
sive fuel. Gas-fired plants cannot be 
economically converted to other fuel 
sources, so SPS must construct coal-fired 
plants to meet the energy needs of its 
customers. Coal-fired plants are more expen­
sive to construct than gas-fired, but the SPS ................ „
engineering and design staffs are able to build coal-fired plants at 
about one-half the national average.

Berry Smith, reports control supervisor. Amarillo.

Knowing what electricity is worth 
is worth knowing. For answers 
to your questions, call or write 

your SPS manager.

ft

SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE COMPANY

6

i
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GOLDEN ANNIVERSARY-Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Shafer 
will be honored with a reception, on observance of their 
50th wedding anniversary, Sunday, Match 14, from 2-5 
p.m. in their home at Needmore. Hosting the reception 
will be their children, Lewis Wayne Shafer of Star Route, 
Sudan, and Bruce Shafer of Friona, and six grandchildren. 
Zeffa Stevenson and Lewis Shafer were married March 19, 
1932 in Farwell.

Pot Roast Italian Style

Italians are renowned for their generous family meals and 
hospitality. If you’ve got a large crowd to feed, give them a 
flavor of old Italy with Pot Roast Neapolitan. The chuck 
roast is browned, then simmered in spaghetti sauce loaded 
with California ripe olives. Use prepared spaghetti sauce or 
make your own -  in either case don’t forget to add those 
crunchy dark ripe olives to give this roast an extra special 
flavor and texture.

Pot Roast Neapolitan
5 lb. rolled and tied 2 cups pitted California

boneless chuck 
roast 2

2 tablespoons oil
1 cup diced onion 1
1 cup diced celery 1/4
1 cup water 1/2
Brown roast in oil, using a heavy oven proof roasting pan. 

Add onion, celery and water. Roast, covered, in a 325° oven 
for 2 hours. Add olives, spaghetti sauce and garlic salt. Continue 
roasting, covered, for an additional 2 hours or until tender. 
If desired, thicken sauce with flour blended with cold water. 
Makes 8 generous servings.

Suggestion: Serve with spaghetti and Italian green beans.

ripe olives, halved 
cups prepared spaghetti 

sauce
teaspoon garlic salt 
cup flour 
cup cold water

Best Of Press q &
Team Work

If you think coopera­
tion is not necessary, try 
running a wagon with a 
wheel off.

-News, Saginaw.

True
Truth may be stranger 

than fiction but it will 
never sell for as much.

-Times, Louisville.

Just So
Propaganda is baloney 

so artfully disguised that 
it passes as food for 
thought.

-Enquirer, Cincinnati.

It Helps
To be conscious that 

you are ignorant is a great 
step towards knowledge.

-Grit.

d a m
Shoes for spring will be 

very colorful. There’s a color 
or combination of colors to 
blend with every outfit. 
Shops are showing cool cut­
out styles in glittery metal- 
lies, strains and pastels with 

luster.

Springtime Brings Poison 
Hazards For Children

Children are loving ac­
tive creatures, unfortun­
ately they can also eat and 
drink peculiar things. “ We 
see children eating plants, 
medicines, cleaning agents 
as well as soap, bugs and 
all sorts of other things,” 
said Michael Ellis, Director 
of the Texas State Poison 
Center.

In 1981 the Poison Cen­
ter received some 21,000 
poisoning calls. “ About 75 
percent of these inquiries 
are about children under 
five years old,” Ellis not­
ed. "Many of the acciden­
tal ingestions by children 
are of little consequence, 
but some can be life- 
threatening. Liquid furni­
ture polishes, lamp oil, 
gasoline and other oil-bas­
ed products can kill with as 
little as one sip.”

Springtime can be a par­
ticularly bad time of the 
year. “ Blooming plants, 
fertilizers, plant foods, in­
secticides, and gasoline 
ingestions become almost 
epidemic this time of 
year,’’said Ellis, “ along 
with the numerous house­

hold cleaning products out 
for spring cleaning.”

The fact that the product 
might be foul-tasting does­
n't really apply on a one 
swallow basis • when you 
are a two year old. Our 
rule of thumb at the Poison 
Center is “ if it is small 
enough to get in the mouth 
and doesn't bite first, it 
will be eaten,” Ellis warn­
ed.

As the weather warms 
up and children are in and 
out of the house more, they 
seem to be able to find
more.

In the event of a poi­
soning emergency, the first 
thing to do is to call the 
Texas State Poison Cen­
ter at 1-713-765-1420. The 
Poison Center staff will 
help you determine if 
medical attention is re­
quired, or if the problem 
can be handled at home. 
“ About 85 percent of our 
inquiries can be handled at 
home,” Ellis noted, “ thus

r
i West Plains

Medical Center
Report

l________________________
ADMITTED

Feb. 25-Teresa Salinas, 
Amelia Castillo, Rosa Tos­
cano and Ernest Martin.

Feb. 26-Robert Castro, 
Gregory Combs, Opal 
Lambert, Mildred May, 
Paul Chamberlin, Carol 
Kennemer, Frank Balder- 
ez, Tiffany Gutierrez, Lucy 
Rocha and Nellie Luna.

Feb. 27-Patsy Shafer, 
Vanita Eloy, L. V. Hall Sr.

Feb. 28-Leandro Sau- 
ceda. and Juan Trevino..

March 1-Jan Shafer.
DISMISSED 

Feb. 25-Annie Miller, 
Maria Arce and baby girl, 
Perla Chico, Nonette Ro­
binson and baby boy, Ger­
ald Reyna.

Feb. 26-Susie Soto, V. 
G. Latham, Teresa Garcia, 
Paul Chamberlin, Wayne 
Thatcher, Tonya Gray, 
Donald Dale, Manuela Re- 
jino, Juanita Jarman.

Feb. 27 -  Christopher 
Donnell, Teresa Salinas 
and baby boy, Nancy
Cochran, Minnie Christo­
pher.

Feb. 28 -- Paul Cham­
berlin.

March 1-Greg Combs, 
Pam Marquez, Nellie 
Luna.

“Easy Does It” 
Lifestyle In 

Mobile/Manufactured 
Homes

By Lisa Drake
Consumer Affairs Advisor 

Manufactured Housing Inst it u te
A mobile/manufactured 

home not only offers afford­
able housing that represents 
a solid, appreciating invest­
ment, it can create a whole 
new lifestyle for its occupants.

According to  the Manu­
factured Housing Institute, 
the average price of today’s 
mobile/manufactured home is 
only $18,500, an amount well 
within reach of most retired 
persons.

However, affordability is 
no t the only  reason  th a t 
retired persons make up' one 
of the largest g roups .of 
mobile/manufactured home 
ow ners. Built to conserve 
space and energy, mobile/ 
manufactured homes enable 
owners to enjoy their leisure 
to the fullest extent. They’re 
not burdened by an endless 
succession of house mainte­
nance chores because modem 
mobile/manufactured homes 
require only minimal mainte­
nance. Instead, the entire 
family can fill its days with 
the things it wants to do 
because it has more free 
time.

The new life s ty le  fre­
quently ex ten d s to  the 
mobile/manufactured home 
community, many of which 
offer a v a r ie ty  of activities 
for re s id e n ts . There are 
swimming pools, tennis and 
shuffleboard courts, and a 
broad range of recreational 
programs readily and con­
veniently available.

Mobile/manufactured home 
living is indeed setting a new 
lifestyle — particularly for 
A m erica 's active retired 
persons.

lORISIIIMI
Complete & Balanced 

Nutrition Dog Food 
PUPPY FOOD
27% PROTEIN

20 LB. Bog ^ 5 ^

HI-PROTEIN 
DOG MEAL 50 IB Bog
26% PROTEIN

Five Point

$ i o *

R EA SO N  #6: H *R  B lock’s  
trained tax preparers

This year there are 47 different 
forms and schedules for income 
tax filers

Using the wrong form, or omit­
ting one, could cost you money 
Or cause an IR S  inquiry H&R 
Block preparers are irarned to 
know the forms and how to use 
each of them to your best advan-

,age 224 W. 2,.d 
,272 3342

'Wkdys 9 6 Sat. 9 5

H*R BLOCK
THE INCOM E TAX PEOPLE 

17 reasons O n * smart decision

' Dog Food
50 LB. Bog

$036
2518. B09

$C15
--------------Alert

T _ A < M  Cat Food

\ 0<̂  fooc

C4r
rOOQ * i

FMIM mo MUCH supply 10 IB. Bog $34s

rushing the person to the 
hospital, is usually unnec­
essary. If the poisoning is 
serious enough to need 
medical attention, the Poi­
son Center will direct you 
to the emergency room and 
then call ahead so that the

TSTI Awards
Construction
Contract

The TSTI board of re­
gents met February 22, on 
the TSTI Waco Campus. 
They approved awarding 
the contract for construc­
tion of the Graphics Com­
munication Technology 
Center to Perry Cates Con­
struction Company. Cates 
was the lowest bidder for 
the project, with a bid of 
one million, 368 thousand, 
850 dollars.

The 29,500 square foot 
Graphics Communication 
Technology Center will 
house Commercial Art in 
Advertising, Drafting and 
Design Technology, and 
Printing Technology. The 
construction on the build­
ing should Start within a 
month, and completed by 
June 1, 1983.

The next board of re­
gents meeting is scheduled 
for April with the meeting 
on the TSTl-Amarillo cam­
pus.

child will be treated quick­
ly-

March 21-27 is National 
Poison Prevention Week - 
and a perfect time to in­
spect your home for poison 
nazards. The fact that no 
small children live in the 
home, does not mean that 
a poisoning cannot occur. 
“ Nearly everyone has a 
small niece or nephew, 
grandchild, or a friend with 
small children -  all of 
whom may visit occasion­
ally." Ellis said, “ and that 
makes them prime candi­
dates for a poisoning acci­
dent.” Every home should 
have a bottle of syrup of 
Ipecac, particularly if small 
children live there. This 
nauseating liquid is used to 
cause vomiting in the poi­
soned child, if vomiting is

indicated. “ Sometimes, we 
don’t want the child to 
vomit," Ellis said, “ so the 
parent needs to talk with 
the Poison Center first, 
before using the Ipecac. 
But it is the only safe way 
to induce vomiting. Other 
household remedies like 
mustard and water, salt 
water, etc. - are both in­
effective, and can be quite 
hazardous themselves.”

SMILES

The first bicycle trip around 
the world was made by 
Thomas Stevens, who started 
from San Francisco, Calif., 
on April 22, 1884 on a 
50-inch bicycle and returned 
January 4, 1887.

1st neighbor; "How did 
that naughty little boy of 
yours get hurt?"

2nd neighbor; "That 
good little boy of yours hit 
him with a brick.”

A h , Bat The Flavor
“Your husband gets a lot 

of sentiment out of his pipe, 
doesn't he?"

“Indeed he does. It’s per­
fectly disgusting to see him 
clean it.”

Swell Comparison
Asking a woman her age
Is like buying a second 

hand car;
The speedometer’s been 

set back,
But you can't tell just how 

far.
w m w w m 1 . ^  w w « m > r r M ' r M S » > r r f

Muleshoe Area Lenten Seafood Sale
Saturday $ March 6 

2-6:30 p.m.
Shop Rite Parking Lot

Jumbo Shrimp-Live Gulf Crabs- Alaskan King Crab Legs- Sea Scallops - 
Dressed Fresh Water Catfish-Drumfish-Buffalo Mullet-Redfish-Trout-Fresh 
Oysters - Oysters In The Shell

And Other Availible Seafoods

^  C) c/ferAet
-«- -*- ■ i m, j > m m ,

Tha B O N N A R D  • N1310RT
Almond textured hnish with 
contrasting NickeWSoW color 
tnm Almond color pedestal

$ 29800
QUALITY FEATURES IN SMALL-SCREEN TV!
• TRI-FOCUS PICTURE TUBE tor exceptional sharpness.
« TRIPLE-PLUS C H ASS IS— 100% modular design tor

• AUTO-CONTROL COLOR SYSTEM -once picture has bean 
adjusted, maintains accurate oohor, tint ana oontrest.

• Electronic Power Sentry Voltage Regulator
• Super Video Range Timing System

NEWI982
feM iT iL

I T G O L O R T V

Quality makes the 
Zenith difference!
TRi-FOCUS PICTURE TUBE for 
exceptional picture sharpness
TRIPLE-F’LUS CHASSIS 
for outstanding reliability

The PEN N ELL* N1720W
Smart, compact styling 
Simulated grained American 
Walnut finish with satin Silver 
color trim Bright Aluminum 
color highlights control aiea 
Super Video Range luner

STOP IN TODAY! BUY NOW!
The quality goes in before 
the name goes on

SHOWTIME™ 
ANYTIME!

Stylish simulated walnut cabinet.

T £ N £ T H

VIDEO 
DISC PLAYER

A Record Player That Plays Movies 
On Your TV

M odel VP2000W

Push-button Cot«w. nonce 
• Visual Search with Picture 

(forward and reversal-lets you 
scan a disc at 16 times normal

2 9 9 95
• Rapid Access (forward and re­

ve rsa l-le ts you speed through 
a disc to find a tavortte scene

• L E  D. Playtime Indicator (forward 
and reverse) -  provides a guide 
to elapsed time to help you pin­
point an exact segment lor replay.

• Pause Control-lets you stop 
the action anywhere to grab a 
snack or answer the phone.

T £ M fT M  1 4  d a y

PROGRAMMABLE

VIDEO DIRECTOR
w ith  th e  p ic tu re  q u a lity  
you e x p e c t f ro m  Z e n itn !

Beta

p r o 9 rarn

V id e o O U ecloT

9 4 8 00

Remote VIDEO ACTION CONTROL with
CLEAR Frame-by-Frame Advance 

Pictures
CLEAR Variable S p eed  Slow  

Motion Pictures 
CLEAR Stop Action Pictures 
S p eed  Search with Picture
PLUS • Beta ffl/H Record and Playback
• 5 Hour Recording Time In Beta DI
• Electronic Tuning System • MUCH,
MUCH MORE!
Cabinet finished in rich Chestnut Leatherette 
finish with Gold color accents

*
%

%*v

ID ifo o n
117 Main Appliances

We Have A 
Trained Technician  

To Service Our 
Products

272-5531
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Muleshoe...
Cont. From Page 1

A •

Sharia Morrison of 
Muleshoe captured second 
place honors at the recent 
1982 San Antonio Livestock 
Exposition with her light
weight Hereford steer.

*•*
Women throughout the 

world will celebrate World 
Day of Prayer on Friday, 
March 5th. Local services 
will be held at 7 p.m. 
Friday, March 5, in the 
Chapel of the First United 
Methodist Church, Mule­
shoe. •**

Citizens are reminded 
that the deadline for re­
gistering to vote in the 
Muleshoe City and School 
Board elections is Thurs­
day, March 4, 1982.

Election will be April 3. 
*•*

It's time to be getting 
ready for the Little League 
season again. Anyone in­
terested in coaching or 
helping to coach a major, 
minor or T-Ball team need 
to be at the Tri-County 
community room on March 
4 at 7:30 p.m.

•**

Muleshoe Young Home­
makers will sponsor youth 
skating, Friday, March 5, 
from 7 til 10 p.m. at the 
Civic Center. Admission is 
S1.00.

Police
Report

i

On February 27, police 
were called to the old City 
Park to investigate a report 
of a motorcycle accident. 
The cycle driver apparently 
hit a tree. A white male 
was taken to West Plains 
Medical Center for treat­
ment of bruises and abra­
sions.

City police arrested a 
white male on February 28 
for theft of gas from the 
Target Gas Station. He was 
also arrested for public in­
toxication.

A white male was ar­
rested February 28 for fail- 
uree to appear on a traffic 
violation. He was released 
on bond and ordered to 
appear before the City 
Judge on March 1.

A February 26 investi­
gation of a reported gas 
theft from the Muleshoe 
Country Club, led police 
officers to discover a dam­
aged newsstand in a Field 
adjacent to the club. Fur­
ther investigation led offi­
cers to three other news­
stands and one black male, 
one black male juvenile 
and one white male. The 
suspects were questioned 
about tburglary of the pap­
er coin machines which 
had apparently happened 
just hours before the police 
discovered the suspects.

A breakin of a local resi­
dence was reported to po­
lice over the weekend, and 
the Country Club reported 
the theft of approximately 
90 gallons of gasoline from 
a storage tank.

Taxes...
Cont. From Page 1 

and before May 1.
School districts grant a 

S5.000 general homestead 
exemption to all qualified 
homeowners. A $10,000 
school homestead exemp­
tion is offered to citizens 65 
years or older and to dis­
abled persons.

An advantage associated 
with the over 65 exemp­
tion is that senior citizens 
receive a "tax freeze or tax 
ceiling" on the school tax­
es they are assessed in the 
first year of qualification. 
Although the assessed 
valuation of their home­
steads are free to fluctuate 
with the market, the school 
taxes will not increase.

An exception to this 
would be the addition of an 
improvement, excluding 
repairs or general main­
tenance. In that case, the 
value of the new improve­
ment would be taxes at the 
current rate and added to 
the previous tax ceiling to 
create a new ceiling.

Counties offer a $3,000 
general homestead exemp­
tion to all taxpayers. This 
exemption can be granted 
only on the portion of the 
county tax levied for farm- 
to -market roads/flood 
control.

Many taxing units, in 
addition, may offer the 
new local-option home­
stead exemption based on 
a percentage of the home's 
value. Due to a constitu­
tional amendment passed 
in last November’s general 
election, any taxing unit 
may exempt UP TO 40 and 
percent of the value of all 
homesteads. No matter the 
percentages, the exemp­
tion must be at least $5,000 
and this exemption is 
granted at the option of 
each taxing unit’s govern­
ing body.

However, as of this writ­
ing, the The Journal has no 
knowledge of any new 
homestead exemption be­
ing offered in addition to 
the original homestead 
exemption in the Bailey 
County Appraisal District.

For more information, 
homeowners should con­
tact the Bailey County Ap­
praisal District at Mule­
shoe, 272-5501.

Boy, These 
Maytags 

Are Really

Your Authorized 
Soles & Service 

Dealer

M W
1 2 2  S . 1s t  
2 7 2 - 3 0 3 0

GRAND PRIZE WINNER Kem Bales won the drawing for 
the Grand Prize at the Bailey County Electric Coop 
meeting Saturday. The award was a Hotpoint microwave 
oven.

Trading...
Cont. From Page 1

42 and 52, staples 31 and 
32 mike 35 - 49 at about 45 
cents per pound, up 50 
points from a week earlier. 
Grade 52, staple 32, mike 
30 • 32 sold around 39.40 
cents, up from 25 points. 
Gins paid growers $70 to 
$80 per ton for cottonseed, 
mostly $75.

Lubbock Marketing Ser­
vice office classed 21,000 
samples during the week 
ended February 25 for a 
season's total of 2,317,000. 
This compares with 1,614- 
000 classed by the same 
a year ago.

Predominant grades 
were grade 42 at 17 per­
cent, grade 52 - 38 percent, 
grade 4 3 -1 1  percent and 
grade 53 was 18 percent. 
About 87 percent of the 
samples were reduced one 
grade because of bark. Ten 
percent was below grade.

Predominant staples 
were staple 29 at 14 per-

Council...
Cont. From Page 1 
the city’s water wells. 
Some upgrading and repair 
will be necessary within 
the next year.

The Council also passed 
a motion regarding the 
transfer of delinquent ac­
counts to bad debts.

Council members were 
reminded of the Associa­
tion of Mayors and City 
Councilmen’s annual
meeting to be held June 
5-8 in Austin, Texas.

Not Like The Flood
An American died and 

went to Heaven, and prompt­
ly started to boast about his 
native land. "Do you know," 
he told a group of spirits, 
"that at Niagara Falls eight 
billion cubic feet of water 
flow over the cliffs every 
second!"

"P o o f!”  said Noah, 
scornfully, "dew-drops.”

Rebate
Cont. From Page 1

the same law that legalized 
mixed drink sales, is 
collected by the Alcoholic 
Beverage Commission and 
rebates are sent quarterly 
to cities and counties by 
the ^Comptroller.

cent, staple 30 - 45 per­
cent, staple 31-30  percent 
and staple 32 was seven 
percent for an average of 
30.3 thirty-seconds of an 
inch.

Micronaire 35 - 49 was 
15 percent, 33 - 34 was 14 
percent, 30 - 32 was 27 was 
percent, 27 - 29 was 26 
percent and 26 or below 
was 27 per cent for an 
average of 30.

Ban...
Cont. From Page 1 
one state.

The Council president 
pointed out that weather 
has to be taken into con­
sideration in every farming 
operation, and that unex­
pected rain can make it 
necessary for farmers to 
repeat Bind preparation or 
insecticide applications.

"With today’s high fuel 
and chemical prices, each 
such operation may cost as 
much as $10 or more per 
acre,” he added.

Breihan said the pro­
posal to end the program 
comes at a time when far­
mers are especially finan­
cially vulnerable to weath­
er problems. Most have 
had two successive years of 
financial losses due to the 
drought in 1980 and to un­
usually low prices this sea­
son, he added.

"W e strongly urge that 
you and your committee 
find a way to continue this 
highly valuable program in 
fiscal 1983," the Council 
president wrote.

Coop...
Cont. From Page 1 
were T. M. Tanner, Need- 
more Community Center. 
F. A. Grimsley, Gary 
Hooten, Hugh Fore, Wiley 
Moore, W. S. Turner, Don 
M. Lowe, Adoplh Wittner, 
Andrew Wittner, Douglas 
B. Taylor and Jack Bates.

Mimms Inducted 
Into National 
Honor Society

Twenty-nine Lubbock 
Christian College students, 
who rank in the top 10 
percent of the junior and 
senior classes, will be in­
ducted into the Alpha Chi 
national Honor Society.

The ceremony, set for 
February 25, will include 
Quentin Mimms, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Dalton 
Mimms of Route Three, 
Muleshoe.

■ In order to attain en­
trance in this prestigious 
national organization, a 
student must maintain at 
least a 3.6 grade point 
average.

The Alpha Chi National 
Honor Society began in 
1915, as a campus honor 
society to recognize scho­
larship.

Bruce Logue, minister of 
the Green Lawn Church of 
Christ, will be the speaker 
for the event.

Alpha Chi sponsors are 
Dr. Jim Baker, professor of 
Foreign Languages and 
Chairman, Department of 
Foreign Languages; Dr. 
Christa Dobbs, Professor 
of Business Administration 
and Chairman, Department 
of Business Administra­
tion; and Dr. Don Wil­
liams, Professor of Speech 
Communication and Drama 
and Chairman, Department 
of Speech Communication.

TOOL VALUE I « \ M f f A K E
OF THE MONTH |  1

Ol I III; MON I II

5-Pc. Combination 
Wronch Set
D urab le  chrom a vana ­
dium  steal, drop-forged 
for strength. Sized M  to 
M  inches. Plastic pouch 
for storage. 171/55A

ST0R-A-C0RD
Inside ths molded case is 
a 25-ft. 3-wire cord which 
provides 3 grounded out­
lets Case also has a han­
dle and pow er m onitor 
ligh t 4 8 7 7 0 ''#

R E E  t21
4401 Sin Utcbea Bags

33-Gal. Rubbish 
& Trash Bags
You'll want a supply of 
these heavy duty bags for 
spring cleanups— plus 
storage of out-of-season 
items. TVH12TLK27

ATTENTION: 8-I-82 New Store Hours
Mon.- Fri. 8:00 A.M. - 6:80 P.M. 

S»t.8:00 A.M. - 6:00 P.M.

i
& Cox,  In c .

Beef.,
Cont. From Page 1 
Animal Science of Texas 
A&M University.

The course will begin at 
7 p.m. March 8 in the High 
School vocational agricul­
ture building, and will be 
under the sponsorship of 
the Vo-Ag Department, 
according to Harold Home, 
superintendent, and Carl 
Wheeler and John Rey­
nolds, vo ag teachers at 
Muleshoe High School.

Mimms is a junior ac­
counting major and a 1980 
graduate of Lazbuddie 
High School. He has been 
a member of the Senate, 
Koinonia and has received 
the honor of being on the 
Dean's list.

SPAG...
Cont. From Page 1 

Persons wanting to ride 
the Senior Citizen Van 
should call Homer Millsap 
at 272-4994 to schedule an 
appointment. If there is no 
answer they should call 
Melba Bratcher at her of­
fice, 272-3647.

Jarvis...
Cont. From Page 1
his vocation for the past 
three years. He also likes 
music and sings in the 
Chapel Choir. George 
plays a baritone tuba in the 
varsity band and plays de­
fensive tackle on the var­
sity football team. He is a 
member of the Fellowship 
of Christian Athletes and is 
a member of the A and B 
honor roll.

To quote the article, 
Geofge said, " if  it were not 
for the Ranch, I would 
probably have never fin­
ished school.”

• *  • *

The end of the world 
will arrive on time; so 
don 't worry about the 
predictions.

* * * *

Theory is all right for 
books but it takes practi­
cal expression of ideals to 
make life better.

*  *  • *

If you have something 
to do "one of these days,” 
you might as well get busy 
and do it, or you won’t
have time to do it.

• * • *

The man who, in his 
business, resorts to tricks 
and doubtful practices, 
need not wonder why his 
son grows up to be a 
downright crook.

Texas United Teenager 
State Finals In June

Young ladies of this area 
are invited to enter the 
Texas United Teenager 
Pageant to be held at the 
Dallas Hilton, June 28, 29 
and 30, 1982, in Dallas, 
Texas. The Texas Pageant 
is the Official State pre­
liminary to the Miss United 
Teenager Pageant, a Na­
tional Pageant that inclu­
des all fifty states.

Contestants will be jud­
ged on Scholastic and Civic 
Achievements, Beauty, 
Poise, and Personality No 
swimsuit competition or

Indennity 
Rates Adopted
On Brucellosis

New indemnity rates for 
animals slaughtered be­
cause of brucellosis have 
been adopted by the Texas 
Animal Health Commission 
on an emergency basis.

They are: grade beef $50 
compared to $62 for the 
previous rate; grade dairy 
$250, compared to $368 for 
the previous rate; purebred 
$500; this compares to an 
average rate of $744 for the 
previous rate.

The indemnity rates are 
paid with federal funds; no 
state money is involved. 
These changes will allow 
the savings in the federal 
indemnity rates to be used 
in other phases of the 
Texas brucellosis program.

Dr. John W. Holcombe, 
executive director, Texas 
Aniaml Health Commission 
explained the emergency 
changes have become nec 
essary so that the fee basis 
testing program and first 
point testing programs can 
be continued at their pre­
sent financial levels. He 
said the Commission is 
seeking to make this rule 
change permanent.

talent is involved. Contest­
ants must be between 14 
and 18 years of age as of 
December 31, 1982 and 
must have at least a "B ” 
average in school.

Each contestant accept­
ed will be requested to 
participate in the Volunteer 
Community Service Pro­
gram of their choice. This 
program teaches teenagers 
to share and participate in 
school and civic affairs by 
contributing a minimum of 
eight hours time to some 
worthwhile Civic or Volun­
teer work to benefit the 
community before Pageant 
time. Each contestant is 
required to write and pre­
sent on stage an essay 
entitled "My Country.”

The winner of the Texas 
Pageant will receive an 
all-expense paid trip to 
compete in the Miss Unit­
ed Teenager National Pa­
geant; a three phase pa­
geant, to be held in Holly­
wood, California (State 
Costume); Honolulu, Haw­
aii, (Essay) and Washing­
ton, D. C. (Finals). Among 
the prizes that will be 
awarded at the National 
Pageant in 1982; $15,000 in 
scholarships and awards, 
automobile for the reigning 
year; $5,000 personal ap­
pearance contract, $2,000 
wardrobe.

Those interested in en­
tering the Texas United 
Teenager Pageant may 
write for information to 
Janice Billings, P. O. Box 
1821, Fayetteville, North 
Carolina 28302 or call (919) 
822-1453.

She Knew
Ruth--I wonder when 

Arthur is going to propose? 
He’s being going with me for 
nearly six months.

Elsie-You’ll have to wait 
six months more. He didn’t 
propose to me for nearly a 
year.

COCA COLA
Six Pack Cans

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
MARCH 4-6.1982 

WHILE SUPPLIES LAST

CRISPY. FRESH COOKED

CORN DOGS
3„?1

MORTON BEEF OR CHICKEN

Pot P ies 2.89c SUNSHINE KRISPY

Crackers 1 LB. 
BOX 89c

Drinks Fountain
Coke, Dr. Pepper,
Sprite, Orange 12 oz.

Folgers

1 9 c Coffee
8

1 LB. Can269

Popcorn 1 9
Allsups

Bread
l l/i LB. Loaf 2/*l 19

Giant Size

Tide 81 79
Glad

Trash Bags
10 ct. 30 Gal. Size

$ J 8 9

Allsups Every Day Low Prices

Milk 8
1 Gal.

W got to be goo</,

1857
BORDEN’S HIPRO

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

THERE’S ORE HEAR YOU'

MILK Villi.
era.

BORDENS PRUHIUM

Ice Cream
"$169
ViBIL. I bo.cti.

BORDEN'S C0TTA8E

CHEESE W. 79c



Varsity Track Records...
Cont. From Page 1

I
Muleshoe High School 
History are as follows:

100
Donnie Shafer 9.6 1956
Terry Hutton 9.9 1966
Travis Bessire 10.0 1962

g  Derrell Oliver 10.0 1960
Wilcey Moore 10.1 1947
Rueben Gonzales 10.1 1976
Rick Bell 10.2 1962
Eugene Buhrman 10.2 1952
Jim Bickel 10.2 1947
Charles Briscoe 10.2 1979

•  2 2 0
4

Travis Bessire 21.7 1962
Donnie Shafer 22.1 1956

Reynolds 22.3 1954
Terry Hutton 22.4 1966
Eugene Buhrman 22.8 1952
Gaylord Tate 23.0 1954
Randy Norman 23.0 1975

9  Larry Sexton 23.3 1976
Jim Norman 23.3 1979
Charles Walker 23.4 1979

HIGH JUMP
Doug Precure 
Robert Seagroves 
Danny McNeal 
Charles Briscoe 
Don Douglas 
Monty Jones 
Carroll Precure 
Bryce Holmes 
Ronnie Cox 
Mark Northcutt

6’4”
6*4”
6*3”
6 ’2*’
6' 0”

6*0”

6*0”

6 ’ 0 ”

6*0”

S’lO”

SHOT PUT
Bob Camp 
Sam Whalin 
Don Heathington 
Dusty Davis 
Dick Pylant 
Matt Phelps 
Marvin Lewis 
Billy Balderas 
Abel Ontiveroz 
Derrell Oliver

54*2”
S T M "
52’6 "
5 r 5 "

50*1”
49*1”
46’10'/j”
46’8”
46*3”
45’H ”

440
Jim Norman 49.3 1980

% Jerry Gilbreath 49.6 1963
Martin Oliver 50.0 1939
Jimmy Clyde Holt 50.2 1954
Gaylord Tate 50.3 1955
Myron Young 50.5 1967
Jerry Gilbreath 50.9 1963
Rueben Gonzales 51.0 1975
Larry Sexton 51.7 1976
Jerry Harrison 52.0 1963

880

DISCUS
Billy Balderas 
Matt Phelps 
Don Heathington 
Dusty Davis 
Joe Pat Riley 
Bill Willis 
Carroll Precure 
Marcus Beversdorf 
Dick Pylant 
Jack Dunham

POLE VAULT

154*8”
152*8”
150*6”
148*1”
142*4”
141*6”
138*7”
138*0”
1379”
136*0”

Larry Sexton 1:59.3 1976 Brent Maddox 12*6”
Jimmy Clyde Holt 1:59.8 1954 David Roberts 12*0”
Woody Lambert 2:00.0 1938 Mickey Wilson 12*0”
Joe Adams 2:00.0 1966 Michael Davenport 12*0"
Doyle Henry 2:00.0 1955 Raul Garcia 12*0”
James Atwood 2:01.0 1980 Sammy Donaldson 11*6%
Jerry Harrison 2:04.0 1963 R. L. Propps 11*6”
Robert Richards 2:05.0 1954 Archie Evans 11*6”
Johnny St. Clair 2:05.0 1966 Gary Strahan 11*6”
Curtis Elder 2:05.3 1979 Alonzo Ontiveros 11*6”

1978
1%2
1%9
1978 
1966
1979 
1981 
1981 
1981 
1978

1960
1980 
1971 
1975 
1963 
1977
1981 
1975 
1979 
1960

1976
1977 
1971 
1975 
1968 
1954 
1981
1978 
1964 
1958

Whatever your service needs are, 
you're sure to find the specialist in 
the Classifieds at reasonable rates.

Read the Classifieds today!

Muleshoe & Bailey 
County Journals

1978
1964
1967 
1981 
1981 
1954 
1947 
1963
1968 
1977

Classified Ads 
offer Service Specialists

MILE
Lee Elder 
Jody Mills 
Buck Johnson 
Martin Lopez 
Mike Cabrera 
Monty Jones 
Martin Mendozqa 
Scott Ellard 
Aldo Almanza 
Larry Lopez

2 MILE
*New Event 
Scott Ellard 
Aldo AQlmanza 
Martin Mendoza 
Danny Mata

^ '■* ;i-V *,

4:23.4
4:39.0
4:40.0
4:42.0
4:46.4
4:48.2
4:50.1
4:51.5
4:52.3
5:01.0
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MILE RELAY

1978
1966
1953
1978 
1962
1979 
1981
1980
1981 
1979

10:16.2
10:17.0
10:35.0
11:25.0

1981
1981
1981
1981

330 INT HURDLES

James Atwood, Jim Norman, Curtis Flder, Mike Northcutt
3:23.7 1980

Myron Young, Mike Rajama, Ramon Gonzales. Terry Field
3:25.0 1967

Jerry Harrison, Dan Smith, lerrv Gilbreath, Jimmv 
Cabrera 3:27.0 1963
Jim Young, Jerry Gilbreath, Billy Gilbreath, Jimmy 
Cabrera 3:27.0 1962
Ronnie Smith, Randy Norman, Gary Wrinkle, Larry Sexton

3:27.8 1975
Ronnie Smith. Rueben Gonzales. Jimmy Ybarra, Dean 
Northcutt 3:29.6 1976

Jim Norman, Charles Briscoe. Mike Northcutt, Curtis 
Elder 3:30.0 1979
Bryce Holmes, J. J. Martinez. Hector Orozco, Monty 
Hysinger 3:33.9 1981
Jimny Cabrera, Don Nicewarncr ( urtis Walker, Billy 
Gilbreath 3:37.6 1961
Martin Oliver, Horace McAdams. Woody Lambert, Claude 
Riley 3:38.0 1938

440 RELAY
Mike Northcutt 38.3 1980
Gary Wrinkle 42.0 1977
Johnny St. Clair 42.0 1966
Tommy St. Clair 42.0 1975
Johnny Hays 42.2 1972
Curtis Elder 42.9 1979
Terry Shafer 43.7 1978
David Pruitt 43.8 1981
Monty Hysinger 44.1 1981
Dick Pena 44.4 1975

120 HIGH HURDLES
Travis Creamer 
Phillip Short 
Gary Wrinkle 
Oakie Alexander 
Monty Hysinger 
Johnny Hayes 
Jimmy Patton 
Don Alexander 
Johnny St. Clair 
Curtis Walker

LONG JUMP
Myron Young 
Eugene Buhrman 
Quincy Kirven 
Jimmy Ybarra 
Dennis Patterson 
Bobby Julian
I l f \  1 ■ ,v« ~IS C lr C ll v l iv v i

Doug Precure 
Rick Bell
Mark Washington

14.5 
14.7 
14.9
15.1
15.2
15.3
15.5
15.6
15.6
15.7

1962
1966
1976
1958 
1981 
1971
1959
1958 
1968
1959

Jimmy Cabrera, Rick Bell, Jerrv Gilbreath, Travis Bessire
43.9 1%2

Rueben Gonzales, Larry Sexton, Dick Pena, Randy 
Norman 44.3 1975
Quincy Kirven, Chris Kirven, Hector Orozco, Monty 
Hysinger 44.3 1981
Gary Wrinkle, Billy Donaldson, Jimmy Ybarra, Ronnie 
Smith 44.5 1976
David Jones, Jimmy Cabrera, Don Finn, Jerry Gilbreath

44.8 1963
Jeep Shanks, Mike Northcutt, Charles Briscoe, Jim 

Norman 44.9 1979

Texas Bingo Enabling 
ACT To Be Enforced

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock announced Febru­
ary 25 that Texas’ new 
Bingo Enabling Act will be 
enforced to the letter by 

the Comptroller’s office.
“ Today 1 wish to put on 

notice everyone who con­
ducts or enjoys the game of

“ Where the game has 
not been approved, we will 
also be following provi­
sions of this law, which 
went into effect November 
10, 1981.”

The Comptroller enclos­
ed copies of the law with 
his announcement.

Bingo in Texas that they The Bingo Enabling Act
will have opportunities to Section 42(c) provides that
vote on this issue April 3 if the act is knowingly vio­

22*4” 1967 and August 14,” Bullock lated, “ the court shall or­
21*6*6” 1953 said. der all proceeds from the
21*4” 1981 “ In areas where there illegal bingo game or
21’2‘/»" 1977 has been avote on this games to be forfeited to
20’5V4” 1979 issue, we are not going to the appropriate governing
20*4” 1966 second-guess the voters. body as a civil penalty.”

t960 ' Where they have approved
20*2” 1978 the game, it will be con­ “ A word to the wise
20*1 %” 1962 ducted according to provi­ should be sufficient,” Bul­
19*9 3/«” 1978 sions of the Bingo Enabl­ lock said. “ We mean to

ing Act.” enforce this law.”

AUTO PARTS STORES

ANNIVERSARY

CARQUEST 
MOTOR OIL
10W40 All season 
or HO 50 wt 
A product of 
Ashland Oil Co.

LIMIT 
1 CASl 

P H
CUSTOMER

icon
FILTERS
Help protect 
your engine

r — ’Co u p o n — - i

!2.0 0 O F F
ANY

FAN BELT OR 
RADIATOR HOSE

CAROUEST 
HEAVY DUTY 
SHOCK
Rts most 
Domestic cars, 
light trucks and 
some imports 
Big 1-3/16 
piston

LIMIT ONE PER CUSTOMER 
Expires March 7,198?

ANCO
WIPER

REFILLS

I CAN HELP

989 #PF2. PF20, 
PF24, PF25, 
PE30, PF35, 
PF40, PF45.

GOT A PARTS PROBLEM?
Ask a Qualified Counterman 

Only CARQUEST has them

Replace 
worn wiper 
blades

ATMOsnocAnoNj

Good at CARQUEST Auto Parts stores thru Mar 7,1982

Muleshoe Auto Parts
217 N. 1st 
272-4596

CARQUEST: th e  R ig h t  Place to  b u y  a u to  parts.

i
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1982 VARSITY  

TRACK SCHEDULE

MARCH 6 ............   IDALOU
MARCH 13 ...........  FLOYDADA
MARCH 20 ...........  PLAINVIEW

MARCH 26-27    SAN ANGELO

APRIL 2 ....................  TULIA
APRII 9-10 ............. AMARILLO
APRIL 17 ...........  DENVER CITY
APRIL 26 .... DISTRICT - HEREFORD 
MAY 7-8 ... REGIONAL - LUBBOCK 
MAY 14-15 ...... STATE-AUSTIN

1982 TRACK COACHES

KEVIN W ISEMAN .............  Head Coach

LESLIE SOTO .............  Vanity Assistant

W IN DY  W ILLIAM S . . . .  Varsity Assistant

RONNIE JONES ....................  8th Grade

ROSS DODSON ....................... 7th Grade

MULESHOE TR A C K M. N i. TSACK S  WILD SCHOOL RECORDS

Event 

100 yd 

220 yd 

400 m

110 yd.

Mils Run 

3200 m. Run 

120 yd. H. H 

300 m. I. H 

440 yd. Beley

Mil# Relay

High Jump 

Long Jump 

Shot Put 

Discus 

Polo Vault

Name

Donnie Sheler 

Travis Bossier 

Jim Norman 

Larry Seston 

La* Eldar 

Scott Ellerd 

Travis Creempr 

Mika Northcutt

Mark

1.4

21.7 

41.3 

1.11.1 

4 23.4 

10 14.2 

M S  

31 3

J GeBerre. R Ball 43.1 
J Gilbreath 
T BMs.ro

M. Young, T. Fields 3.24.8 
R. Gonialas 
C. Beamon

Doug Precure 6 '4“

Myron Young 22 '4 "

Bob Camp 54 '2,‘

Billy Balderos IS4 '8

Brant Maddoi I2 ’6 '

Year

1142

1180

1171

1178

1111

1942

1980

1942

1171

1147

1140

1177

VARSITY TEAM— BACK ROW: PEPE MARTINEZ, EDDIE ALVARADO, RAUL GARCIA, PERRY WHALIN, 
TRENT HYSINGER, MONTY HYSINGER, CHUBBY RAMOS, JIM HOLMES, DAVID PRUITT, THURMAN 
COLEMAN
MIDDLE ROW: ALDO ALMANZA, J. J MARTINEZ, JEFF MEEKS, RONNIE COX, MICHEAL ISAAC, 
JOHN WUERFLEIN, PERRY FLOWERS, RENE REYES, HECTOR GARCIA, SCOTT ELLARD, DANNY 
MATA.
FRONT ROW: RONNIE ANGELEY, DENNIS RUTHARDT, HECTOR OROZCO, TONY LUNA, MICHEAL 
FOSS, MARTIN MENDOZA, ALEX PAEZ, GEORGE VELA.

DISTRICT CHAMPIONS 1981

Event

400 m. Relay

1700 m 

800 m.

110 m. H. H 

100 m.

400 m.

300 m. I. H. 

200 m. Dash 

1400 m. Run 

1400 m. Raley

Pole Vault

High Jump

Long Jump 

Discus 

Shot Put

TOP TIMES —  1981

Name Mark

C. Kirven, M. Hysinger 44.3
H. Orosco, Q. Kirven 

Scott Eilard 10.14.2

Rena Rayas 2.09.1

Monty Hysinger '15.2

Quincy Kirven 11.21

Hector Orosco 53.1

David Pruitt 43.1

Quincy Kirven 23.3

Martin Manooza 4.50.1

B. Holmes, M. Hysinger 3.33.9
J. J. Martinas, H. Orosco 

Michael Davenport 12*0**
Raul Garcia

Carrol Precure 4‘0 "
Bryce Holmes 
Ronnia Con

Quincy Kirven 2 I '4 “

Carrol Pracura I IB '? "

Marvin Lowis 4 6 'I0 ‘V

4 ,-

Go With A Winner In 1982

DISTANCE—
RENE REYES, SCOTT ELLARD, ALDO ALMANZA, DANNY 
MATA, MARTIN MENDOZA, TONY LUNA.

BACK ROW: CHRIS HERNANDEZ, CHARLIA MATA, RUDY 
CISEROS, ANDY ALEXANDER, EDDIE PEREZ, RAY VINSON, 
HECTOR FLORES, COACH SOTO.
FRONT ROW: MIKE DENNEY, MARK MOTON, JOHN ISAAC, 
DAVID REID, NOE MORA, MICHEAL DEL TORO.

W.Q. Casey Ins.

Cashway Grocery 
Dinner Bell Cafe

Johns Custom Mills

Western “66” Co.

SPRINTERS—
BACK ROW: EDDIE ALVARADO, TRENT HYSINGER, RONNIE 
ANGELEY, THURMAN COLEMAN.

These Sports Minded Merchants Back The Mules 100% FRONT ROW: DENNIS RUTHARDT, J. J MARTINEZ,
HECTOR OROZCO, ALEX PAEZ

Shop Rite Western Drug
Harvey Bass Appliance

Western Auto Central Texaco 
Wooley International Inc.

Kemps Discount Furniture
Pay & Save Shook Tire Co.

Irrigation Supply Co. Inc.
A&M Farm & Ranch Supply 

Lambert Cleaners 
Latrells Fashions 

Williams Bros. Office Supply
El Nuevo LeaFs Restaurant First National Bank

¥
¥ i
¥
¥
¥
¥¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

Albertsons Shop For Men Del Toro Plumbing

Henry Insurance & Realty Adrian Photography
. McCormick Seedy Inc.

Farmers Coop Elevator 
Muleshoe Publishing Co.

Bailey County Electric Cooperative Association

1981 REGIONAL QUALIFIERS—
BACK ROW: MARTIN MENDOZA, HECTOR OROZCO, ALDO -t 
ALMANZA.
FRONT ROW: J. J, MARTINEZ, SCOTT ELLARD, MONTY -k 
HYSINGER, RAUL GARCIA. .V

*

# 
*  
tc  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  *
i  * 
*

*  
*  
*

Baker Furniture 

Thornton Chevrolet

*¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥¥*
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BUYING?
SELLING?
CHECKOUT THE...

ADS

DEADLINE FOR CLASSIFIED 
ADS IS TUESDAYS AND  

FRIDAYS 11:00AM

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion,

Per Word -- S. 15 
Minimum Charge-52.30 

2nd Insertion 
Per Word-S. 13 

Minimum Charge-52.00 
CARD OF THANKS 
Charged at Regular 

Classified Rates 
CLASSIFIED DISPLAY 
51.55 per column inch 
BLIND AD RATES 

50% More 
DEADLINE FOR 

INSERTION 
11 a.m. Tues. for Thurs. 

11 a. m. Fri. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

AN Y AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR AN Y ERROR 

AFTER AD HAS RUN 
ONCE.

PERSONALS

CHILDREN’S ART 
CLASSES

Mondays, March 8 - April
26. 4:15-6:15.

OIL PAINTING 
Saturday March 20 
weeks. 9:30-2:30.

NIGHT CLASS 
OIL PAINTING 

Monday March 15 - April 
19.6:30- 9:30.

CAROLYN WALKER 
OIL PAINTING 
WORKSHOP

Techniques. March 25, 26 
and 27 9:30-3:30.

Rheata White Studios. 800 
W. Amer. Blvd., Mule- 
shoe, Call 272-3889 
272-4696. 
l-9t-2tc

or

WE BUY USED 
FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
l-18s-tfc

Tired of problems with 
your roof due to leakage, 
hail and wind. Call for a 
free estimate on a beautiful 
roof that shields against 
the elements. Jerry Hel­
ton. 272-3836. 915 Gum.

Custom farming, 8 row 
equipment. Reasonable 
rates. Call 272-5317 before 
8 a. m. or after 7 p. m. 
l-16s-tfc

FREE complimentary fac­
ial. Mary Kay Cosmetics. 
Yolonda Bell, Beauty Con­
sultant, 925-6664. 
l-8s-tfc

HELP WANTED
Information on ALASKAN 
and OVERSEAS Jobs. 
$20,000 to $50,000 per year 
possible. Call 602-998-0426 
Dept. 0511.
3-8t-2ttp

WANTED: Experienced
beautician. Apply in per­
son at Main St. Beauty 
Salon.
3-8s-tfc

LVN NEEDED: For 3-11 
shift at Muleshoe Nursing 
Home. Good salary and 
benefits with shift differ­
ential. Contact Thelma 
Barker at 272-3861. Equal 
Opportunity Employer. 
3-9s-3tc

Kennedy taped conversa­
tions as president.

INDEPENDENT CAREER 
92-year old financial in­
stitution has an opening for 
an outstanding person de­
siring a career in reward­
ing field. Previous sales or 
business experience valu­
able but not required. Lo­
cal resident. Assured in­
come during training 
period with incentive 
compensation plan. For a 
personal interview, send 
personal resume to Ed 
McCanlies, 112 E. 14th, 
Littlefield, Tx. 79339.
3- 8s-4tfrts

m
SARATOGA GARDENS 
1300 N. Walnut, Friona 

Phone 247-3666 
1, 2, or 3 bedroom apart­
ments modern, wall to wall 
carpet, heating/cooling, 
kitchen equiped, laundry 
facilities, parking. Low 
rent for needy families. 
Call collect.
5-46t-tfc

TRAILER FOR RENT: 14 x 
60 furnished or unfurnish­
ed, central heat and air, 
real clean. 257-3776. Earth 
Tex.
5-9s-tfc

Cabin for rent in Ruidoso. 
Call 272-4365.
4- 9t-8tc

7. WANTED TO RENT 
•a**********************

WANT TO RI 9T: 2 or 3 
BR house with garage, in 
or out of town. 272-5278. 
7-9s-3tc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, brick, living room, 
den with fireplace, office, 
Richland Hill. 272-4701. 
8-21t-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom, 1 
bath, totally remodeled, 
new plumbing and fixtures 
and central heat. Garage in 
back. 272-5186.

160-acre farm for sale. 4 
miles north on Hwy. 214. 
Call 272-4280.
8-6s-tsc

HOUSE AND 2 ACRES: 3 
bedroom, 1 bath, newly 
remodeled inside. Outside 
needs more repair. 272- 
4552 or call Amherst. 246- 
3472, after 6:30.
8-4t-tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 BR, 
1 V«, LR, kitchen-dining 
combination, den, ample 
storage, corner lot, jiear 3 
schools, 1928 sq. ft. living 
area, 621 West 6th. Phone 
272-4732 days or 272-4827 
evenings.

DENT A ASSOCIATES 
REAL -ESTATE

FARMS-RANCHES 
COMMERCIAL 
RESIDENTIAL

LEON DENT, broker 
nites 272-3580

DON RLMPE 
nites 272-4643

1516 W. AMERICAN 
MULESHOE. TX. 79347 

OFFICE 272-4296

LIST YOUR 
PROPERTY WITH US

8-6t-tfc ___________ _
' ' '  ' * '**

Plans to sell federal lands 
blasted by environmentalists.

HOUSE FOR SALE: 2BR, 
IB, garage, fenced back 
yard, good location. Call 

Call 272-3920.418 Dallas. 
8-3t-tfc

Irrigated, new undergr­
ound pipe. 2- 158 acre 
tracts near Muleshoe. 
51150 /  acre Norman Real­
tors 806-795-9514 
8-42s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3-2-2 fenced 
yard, 1 fireplace, large 
den, 272-5135.
8-6t-8tc

For all your real estate 
needs call:

GLAZE A GOFORTH
112 Ave. C 
272-4208

8-11-tfc

Krebbs Real Estate 
201 W. Ave. C 

Appraisals

Serving Muleshoe Area 35 
years. We Appreciate your 
business.
8-52t-tfc

We Want Your Business

REMEMBER

REID REAL ESTATE 
1614 W. American Blvd. 

272-3142

Thursie Reid 
272-3142

Smallwood Real Estate 
232 Main 
272-4838 

*****

3 bedroom, 2 bath, 1 car 
garage, brick, fenced back 
yard.

Duplex, 2 bedroom, 2 bath 
each, small down payment.

3 bedroom, 2 bath, 2 car 
garage, fenced back yard, 
'  2,800 sq. ft.

8-4s-tfc
See or call Joe Small­
wood, Broker

'1 1 4  NORTH MULfSHOC TIM*'

TOWN and
■c o u n t r y

REAL  ESTATE
FAHMB RANCHES HOMES

John W Smith 272 1473, 272 5335 

Large brick home over 
2300 sq. ft. 3 bedroom, 2 
baths, 2 car garage, 
fireplace, central heat­
ing and lots of extras.

Brick home in best of 
neighborhoods. Over 
2000 sq. ft. 3 befrooms, 
2 baths, 2 car garage, 
fireplace, central heat­
ing and refrigerated air. 
Assumable loan of 9%.

Nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath 
brick home with fire­
place. Has 2 car gaiage, 
covered patio, storm 
cellar and back yard 
fence.

Nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath 
stucco house with com­
position shingles. Has 
F.H.A. loan.

Stucco house painted in­
side and out. 3 bed­
rooms, 2 baths. All new 
carpet.

Small 3 bedroom home. 
Asbestos siding. F.H.A. 
loan.
8-St-tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE OR 
FOR LEASE: Attractive L. 
R., Dining Room, Kitchen 
combination (W/fireplace). 
3 bedroom, 2 bath, double 
garage. 272-4428.
8-6s-tfc

Bingham A Nieman 
Realty

116 E. Avenue C 
272-5285 

nights 965-2488 
“ We Appreciate 
Your Business!” 
George A Dianne 

Nieman 
8-49t-l tt

13. PROPERTY 
FOR LEASE

c J -fzn iy

2 bedroom completely 
remodeled, carpet, good 
location. FmHA Approved

Country living 3 bedroom, 
2 bath, double garage, 
brick home on Hwy 2 miles 
from town. Immediate po- 
session.
8-46t-8-46t-tfc

Small acreage 3 miles 
east o f Muleshoe on 
highway.

320 acre farm 5-irriga­
tion wells, underground 
pipe, 2-pivot sprinkler 
systems, 2 houses, all 
metal barn, Lamb Coun­
ty, good terms.

8-8s-tfc

111 W. Avenue B. 
Muleshoe 
272-4581 
8-44s-tfc

FOR SALE: 4-year old 
brick house, 1770 sq. ft., 
3BR, IV* bath, cathedral 
beam ceiling, fireplace, 
skylight, custom brick pat­
io, fenced, corner lot. 1002 
West 7th .272-4737.
8-6s-tfc

CARWRUCKSa P
1974 CHEVROLET VEGA. 
Needs motor. Good body 
and interior. 272-4552. or 
call Amherst, 246-3472, af­
ter 6:30 9-5s-tfc

1976 Buick. Park Avenue. 
965-2448.
9-8t-tfc

....FOR SALE
OR TRADE

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • a  «.»•••

FOR SALE: Warm winter 
nest, furnished 2 BR trailer 
on lake LBJ with stove, 
refrigerator, washer, con- 
refrigerator, washer, cen­
tral heat and air. Nice. 
272-5408. 
ll-2s,tfc

New buildings at factory. 
All parts accounted for. All 
structural steel carries full 
factory guarantee. Build­
ings 10,000 square feet to 
the smallest 1,200 square 
feet. Must sell immediate­
ly. Will sell cheap. Call toll 
free 1-800-248-0063 or 1- 
800-248-0321. Ext. 777. 
ll-9t-2tpts

Miniature dachsund, long 
coat. Will sell cheap. No 
papers. 965-2363.
1 !-9t-2tc

USED 50 hp. IV-8F, Verti­
cal hollow shaft motor, new 
switch gear. $8,1450.00. 
Owens Electric. Hereford, 
Tx. 364-3572.
11- 5t-tfc

HOUSEHOLD
GOODS

BURROWS 
UPHOLSTERY AND 

FURNITURE REPAIR 
209 W. 2nd 

phone 272-4255 .
12- 44s-ltc

LITTON microwave. New. 
$260. Call 272-5289 
l5-9t-2tc

Commercial building 
30’x60' for rent 
272-4878 after 6 p.m. 
13-44s-tfc

’83 VA Budget Requests $25,6 
Billion For Funding
__  * . rto tr i n n r o o c o  »a/iI1 K o

FARM LAND 
FOR LEASE

80 acres, irrigated. For
cash lease. Phone 965-
2647.
14-9t-2tp

MISCELLANEOUS
WANTED TO BUY: 3-BR 
house to be moved. Call 
272-4768.
15-9t-4tc

GORDON PLUMBING 
Licensed and bonded. 

New, repair, commercial 
work. Free estimates. 20% 
discount for senior citizens. 
24 hour service. 272-4111, 
221 East 4th.
15-4s-tfc

FOR SALE: Waterless
cookware. Home demon­
stration kind. Never open­
ed. Normally $600 - selling 
$275. 1-303-685-9092.
15- 8t-3tp

FRANK’S 
REFRIGERATION 

APPLIANCE & SERVICE 
PARTS & REPAIR 

315 W. 3rd Ph. 272-3822 
15-7t-tfc

WANTED TO BUY-aseA 
aluminum pipe of all sizes. 
Also side roll sprinklers of 
all sizes. No quantities too 
large. Top pricer paid. 
Stateline Irrigation 
272-3819 or 272-3450 
15-33t-tfc

4-14x6 white spoke wheels. 
$100. 4-Bridgestone HR 78 
-15 tires. $250. 965-2448.
15-8t-tfc

Want a propane system; 
check with 

SMITH LP GAS 
MULESHOE 

15-30s-tfc

LIVESTOCK

NOW STANDING: Regis- 
tered AQHA Stallion, 
‘Lucky Bug Rex.’ SI-88, 
Conformation, disposition, 
plus. Call 272-5317 after 6
p.m.
16- 4t-tfc

Brave Lad
A couple of young boys 

walked into the dentist’s of­
fice. One faced him boldly 
and said, “ I want a tooth 
took out, and 1 don’t want no 
gas ‘cause I’m in a hurry.’’ 

“ I must say you’re a 
brave boy,” said the doctor. 
"Which tooth is it?”

The little boy turned to 
his silent friend and said, 
“ Show him your tooth, 
Albert.”

The Veterans Adminis­
tration budget request for 
fiscal 1983 seeks $25.6 bil­
lion to fund medical care, 
compensation and pension 
payments and other benefit 
programs for the nation's 
veterans and their families.

The budget request is an 
increase of $867 million 
over the current level, 
which doesn’t provide for 
the 4.8 percent employee 
pay increase in 1982. The

I---------------------* ----------
| Sudan News

By
^  Evelyn Ritchie J

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Rick Gipson, Ricky and 
Dicky, this past week was 
her father, Curley Scrog­
gins of Borger.

*****
Noble Dudgeon was re­

leased last Thursday after­
noon from the Methodist 
Hospital where he has 
been a patient for some 
time. It was reported that 
he is doing well.

*****
The Ruth Sunday School 
class of the First Baptist 
Church met Monday night 
for a salad supper in the 
home of Evelyn Ritchie 
with Billye Doty as co­
hostess.

Following the meal, a 
devotional was given by 
Evelyn on missions, using 
a Navajo story on “ wish­
es.” Rosemary Seymore 

■ — prestatd'—over the- short - 
business meeting when 
Libby Mudgett was select­
ed as a group leader along 
with Mary Harper and Ti­
me Williamson, who were 
selected earlier in the year.

Attending were Sue 
Whiteaker, Helen Church­
man, Libby Mudgett. Mary 
Harper, Madge Beau­
champ, Rosemary Sey­
more. Ruth Baker, Jean 
Harvey and the hostesses. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Dick West 

have returned home from 
Hemphill where they have 
spent the past several 
weeks at the lake. Their 
grandsons, Eric and Mich­
ael Kelley, children of Mr. 
and Mrs. Gary Kelley, of 
Lubbock, have been here 
visiting them.

*****
LEGAL NOTICE 

Notice is hereby given by the 
Parks and Wildlife Department, 
that a public hearing will be held 
at 2 p.m. on Mach 16, 1982 at the 
county courthouse at Muleshoe 
for the purpose of gathering 
information concerning proposed 
hunting, fishing and trapping 
regulations for Bailey County.

As a result of the action by the 
Texas legislature, the Texas 
Parks and Wildlife Commission 
is responsible for the setting of 
seasons, bag limits, and means 
and methods of taking the 
wildlife resources in Bailey 
County. All interested persons 
are urged to attend and comment 
upon the proposed regulations.

pay increase will be ad­
dressed on a government- 
wide basis by the admin­
istration at a later date.

Included in the budget 
submitted to Congress on 
February 8 are legislative 
proposals to provide an 8.1 
percent cost-of-living in­
crease for compensation 
recipients, and several ad­
justments in benefits.

The VA budget request 
provides for increases in 
medical care employment 
that will produce the high­
est staff-to-patient ratio in 
the agency’s history. It will 
provide medical care funds 
for a record 1.35 million 
inpatients treated and for 
18.1 million outpatient 
medical visits. In other 
areas, the budget provides 
funds for the indexed VA 
pension program to com­
pensate for inflation.

The fiscal 1983 budget
«s***JKX**jBsxsaa®rai

The Sandhills 
Pholosopher

Editor's note: The Sand­
hills Philosopher on his 
Johnson grass farm on 
Sandy Creek discusses hu­
man nature this week, sort 
of.

Dear editor:
I was reading the letters 

to the editor in a news­
paper the other day and 
ran across-one (bat asked a
question.

Why, the writer asked, 
would a millionaire holding 
down a big government job 
paying $60,000 a year with 
limousine furnished accept 
a thousand-dollar-stuffed 
envelope when it’s against 
the law?

I know the answer; it’s 
on account of human na­
ture.

The fact that a man has 
a million dollars doesn't 
mean he’s not interested in 
picking up more. There's 
something about cash in 
hand that practically all of 
us find very satisfying. Not 
all of us however are in a 
position to get it from 
under the table, or would 
take it if the chance arose.

I knew a young boy once 
who, while walking home 
from school along a dirt 
road, found a shiny new 
50-cent piece. He held it in 
his hand and admired it 
happily, feeling like the 
whole world was on his 
side.

Then he pitched it for­
ward and walked up and 
picked it up again, recap­
turing the fine sensation of 
spotting a half-dollar on* 
the ground. He did this 
several times, just for the 
sheer fun of it.

I don’t care how rich a 
man is, you won’t fine one 
who, on spotting a $5 bill 
on the sidewalk, won't stop 
to pick it up. It would be a' 
violation of human nature 
not to. Face it. money is 
fascinating.

This explains why poli­
ticians accept cash hand­
outs in envelopes. Some 
then put it in an office safe 
and claim they forgot about 
it. What they mean is they 
hope everybody else will 
forget about it. They’re 
unable to recognize that 
money under the table is 
different from a half-dollar 
found on the way home 
from school.
Yo u r s  f a i t h f u l l y .

J. A.
P- S. 1 sure enjoyed spend­
ing that half-dollar.

request is based on VA 
estimates that 2.3 million 
veterans with service-con­
nected injuries or illnesses > 
-  and 354,000 survivors of 
veterans who died of ser­
vice-connected causes-will 
receive a total of $10.1 
billion in compensation 
payments during the year. 
Some of the offsetting sav­
ings of S208 million would 
be realized through lim­
iting payments for depen­
dents to veterans who are 
rated more than 50 percent 
disabled.

Pension payments of 
$3.9 billion will be made to 
about 820,000 wartime 
veterans and 943,000 sur­
vivors of wartime veterans.

The budget seeks $7.72 
billion for the agency’s 
medical department -  an 
increase of $542 million 
from the current fiscal 
year.

Four nursing home units 
are scheduled for activa­
tion during fiscal 1983, 
bringing the total number 
of operating nursing home 
care beds to 9,847. The 
budget also provides for 
one new outpatient clinic 
and the expansion of five 
others.

The agency requested 
$611.5 million in construc­
tion funds -  an increase of 
$137.2 million above the 
current budget. Emphasis 
will be on six major mo­
dernization and replace­
ment projects^ .eight., pro­
jects to correct fire and 
safety code deficiencies, 
four additional nursing 
home units and the Albu­
querque medical center.

The agency plans to 
open new national ceme­
teries during fiscal 1983 at 
Indiantown Gap, Pennsyl­
vania, and at Quantico, 
Virginia. The budget also 
seeks funds for further 
development at Fort Snell- 
ing National Cemetery in 
Minnesota.

Overall VA employment 
will increase by 955 during 
the fiscal year to a total of 
218,420. Department of 
Medicine and Surgery em­
ployees will increase by 
1,167 and Department of 
Veterans Benefits employ­
ment will decline by 218 
persons, reflecting the de­
crease in G1 Bill education 
benefits recipients.

The budget also propos­
es other savings of about 
$26 million by means of 
legislative changes.

RECIPE '
By Sank Aaae SkerMtn

We will continue this 
week with another recipe to 
use fresh, frozen, or canned 
cherries. This delicious fruit 
can be used in many 
tempting ways.

Cherry Salad

2 c canned sweetened 
cherries.

1 c diced bananas
V* c chopped nuts
1 c diced marsh­

mallows
'/i c mayonnaise
'/> c cream, whipped stiff 

Lettuce

Drain cherries well and 
mix with the other ingredi­
ents, except lettuce leaves 
and nuts. Be sure to drain 
cherries well and have the 
cream stiffly whipped Add 
the dressing, a little at a 
time, taking care not to use 
too much.

Serve on lettuce leaves 
and garnish with chopped 
nuts.

Conversational Gambit?
"Where have you been 

for the last two hours?"
“Talking to a girl."
“What did she say?”
"No!"
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Sunco

TURKEYS
USDA 

Grade A 
10-14 Lbs.

PORK
ROAST

Boston 
Butt 

Bone In

SIRLOIN TIP
Whole 
Cry-O-Vac 

Beef Roast

GROUND

Lean

3 Lb. Avg.

* 1 6 9
Owen's
SAUSAGE.......................1 Lb- R°"

SAUSAGE....................... 2 Lb. Roll *3 35
Oscar Mayer Variety Pak .

LUNCHMEAT.......................>2<«. 1
Sliced, Oscar Mayer Meat or Beef

BOLOGNA...............................................8 o z  ♦ l07
Boneless Waste Free Beef Steak

SIRLOIN TIP...............................Lb 2 69
Peyton Ranch Brand

FRANKS.................................>2 02 99°
Peyton Thrifty

CHORIZO .........................Lb *1 OB

POTATOES
Bake'em
Boil'em
Fry'em

i i WINNER

20 Lb. Bag

ROMAINE LETTUCE

CARROTS

Each of these advertised items is required to be 
readily available for sale at or below the advertised 
price in each store, except as specifically noted in 

this ad. We reserve the right to limit quanities. 
None sold to dealers .

PLAY
Put *2,500

in your 
pocket...play

/A

.LA.
0006 CHART IRCCIM JANUARY Ml I M2

PRIZE
VALUE

TOTAL
NOPWlZFS

OF
PRIZES

OOOSFOR 
ONF GAM*

TICKET

COOSFOR 
I3GANE 
TICKETS

OOOSFOR 
26 GAME 
TICKETS 
PLUS 10 
SAVER 
0I8CS

ImSlM

O dds vary depending on number of G am * Tcfcats you ototem ’ 
ticksti you obtain. the b stlsr your chancte o I m m tng O dds k 
“  (10) Sa vsr O acs and quality lor Grand Pn *a  Dravtnje 

Is  H3 arn Grand P n »  Draw ing* will dapand on lt>« numOdds to 
Oac

T <n ?S 
of S a w

Caah K ing Sanaa #C K89 a  being piayad m 13 participating s i  
m Nmm Mexico and Tm as
Scheduled terimnation data of this promotion is Aprt 20. 1962 
C ash  Kmg officially ends urtien ait game tickets are distnbutad

GREEN ONIONS..................................4  r<* *1

Mr. and Mrs. Willie Brown 
won s10000

in our Cash-King Bingo 
at SHOP RITE

P H c u  C o o d  Feb. 2 1 , 1982 H ir e  M a rc h  i ,  1982

DOUBLE COUPONS EVERY 
SATURDAY

GRAPEFRUIT

BEAN SPROUTS .................................^  49«

ORANGES

*15 Lbs.

49

NORTHUP KING GARDEN SEEDS NOW ON SALE

Del Monte Fruit

C O C K TA IL

17 oz. Can 59*

Shurfresh V/2 %

LOW F A T  MILK

1 Gal.
88

Rich & Ready

O R A N G E D R IN K

1 Gal. 88*
Buttermilk, Sweetmilk _  ,  Pillsbury Mix
BISCUITS 8 oz. Can 2  for 3 9 * QUICKBREAD
Facial, Asst., White Carna,k,n Mix
KLEENEX TISSUE 200 ct Box 6 5 * HOT COCOA

T

17 02.
* ^ 2 9 6 9

Electric Perk,

Star Kist, Chunk Lite

T U N A

Welch
GRAPE JELLY 32 oz. Jar ■ Regular Drip 
Shurfine, Crushed, in Syrup FOLGERS

1202 Can *1 29 PINEAPPLE 15V4 02. Can 5 9 * COFFEE l Lb. Can *2*®

'  Lunch Meat

Waldorf

B A TH  TIS S U E

6 Roll Pkg.*1 19

SPAM

Buy One 32 oz. Six Pack of Pepsi or Diet Pepsi at *359 
Get T w o  Six Packs FREE w ith  *10°° Purchase Plus D ep osit

DOUBLE STAM PS S A TU R D A Y


