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Fate Of Rural Influence Now In State Senate 
Hands; House Votes To Gut 17th District 

State Rep. Bob Hunter of 
Abilene is to be commended 
for voting the will of the 
people who voted for him, 
hired him and sent him to 
Austin. 

Rep. Hunter, a Republican, 
voted 	against 	the 
Republican-led effort, which 
will, if passed by the State 
Senate, gut what little rural 
West Texas influence there is 
remaining in Washington. 

Rep. Jim Keffer, also a 
Republican, voted for the 
measure which passed the 
House Tuesday. He is quoted 
as having said that he 
considers U.S. Rep. Charlie 
Stenholm, D-Abilene, a 
friend. But he voted to pit 
Stenholm, the longtime 17th 
Congressional District 
incumbent, against Randy,  
Neugebauer, R-Lubbock, 
who was elected a couple of 
months ago in District 19. 

"It was the best map for 
West Texas the House 
leadership would accept," 
Keifer said. -  

It would seem that Rep. 
Hunter voted for the people 
in his district rather than the 
leadership in Austin. 

The "new map" splits what 
is essentially District 17, into 
District 19 (anchored by 
Lubbock) and District 11 
(anchored by Waco). 

The entire deal could be 
killed in the Senate where the 
House plan now goes, but 
many doubt that it will be. 
Senate rules require a two-
thirds vote before issues can 
before issues can be debated 
in the 31-member chamber. 

The Clyde Post Office will 
host a blood drive on Wednes-
day, July 23. The Meek Blood 
Center Bloodmobile unit will 
be parked at the Post Office 
from 8:30 a.m. until 2:00 p.m. 

In conjunction with the 
blood drive, the Clyde Post 
Office will also be accepting 
bottled water donations which 
will be donated to the Christ's 
Community Resource Center. 
Post Office officials will have 
a mail cart situated in the Post 
Office lobby to accept dona-
tions of bottled water for the 
resource center. 

As many as three lives can 

c. 

Erath County, 
currently in the 
17th district, 
would be split 
between the 
19th andlith 
districts under 
the proposed 

.Plan. 	. 	. 

That means 11 of the 12 
Democrats could defeat the 
plan by voting not to take up 
the issue. 

Rep. Sid Miller (R-
Stephenville) and Rep. Pete 
Laney (D-Hale Center) voted 
against the bill. Campbell of 
San Angelo, Hardcastle of 
Vernon and Hilderbran of 
Kerrville also voted for the 
bill. 

A Senate commitee 
completed its redistricting 
hearings around the state 
Wednesday, setting the stage 
for senators to begin 
debating the issue in Austin. 

At least three senators are 
expected to release 
redistricting maps that differ 
from the one passed by the 
House early Tuesday. 

be saved with a single blood 
donation. Those in need of 
blood include cancer patients, 
trauma victims, surgical pa-
tients, premature babies and 
patients with chronic anemia. 
According to a Meek Blood 
Center spokesperson, as little 
as three teaspoons of blood 
can save the life of a prema-
ture baby. A trauma victim 
may require as many as thirty 
pints of blood upon arrival to 
the emergency room, white a 
cancer patient may require as 
many as eight units of plate-
lets a day while undergoing 
chemotherapy treatment. 

Blood donors must be at 
least 17 years of age, weigh 
at least 110 pounds and be in 
good health. Aspirin and most 
maintenance medications, 

such as blood pressure, cho-
lesterol, hormones and antide-
pressants are acceptable. 
There are some restrictions 
regarding some medications, 
certain medical conditions 
.and travel outside the U. S. 

Anyone with a question re-
garding donor eligibility may 
call Meek Blood Center at 
(325) 670-2805. The blood 
donation process takes be-
tween 45 minutes to 1 hour. 

Each donor will receive a 
patriotic T-shirt and a compli-
mentary cholesterol reading. 
Cholesterol results may be 
obtained two days after the 
blood drive by calling (325) 
670-2799. 

election cycle." 
House Republicans say 

their map could give the GOP 
as many as 21 of the state's 
32 congressional seats. 
Democrats currently have a 
17-15 edge in the delegation. 

Republican Lt. Gov. David 
Dewhurst said the House map 
will not pass the Senate 
without changes. 

Lubbock and chairman of 
the committee, said he has no 
plans to draft his own 
congressional map. He said 
he plans to work toward 
preserving West Texas' 
existing congressional 
districts. 

"I think what we heard in 
San Angelo and Lubbock and 
from what I'm hearing from 
constituents is they don't 
want to see district lines 
changed...," said Duncan, 
who represents San Angelo, 
Lubbock and parts of the Big 
Country. "There are certainly 
areas of the state that don't 
need 'to redistrict, even for 
partisan reasons, in order to 
protect communities of 
interest." 
"I don't like it," Cong. 
Charles Stenholm is quoted as 
having said of the new re-
districting action. 

"The current plan (the one 
now in use) seemed to have 
pleased everybody but Tom 
DeLay. It has support from 
our Texas Delegation on both 
sides of the aisle. It is a plan 
very appropriate for Texas." 

He suggested that citizens 
should express their feelings 
to their representative and to 
Sen. Troy Fraser who covers 

much of the same district. 
The Senate is to consider 

the House Bill immediately. 
Cong. Stenholm pointed 

out that the $1.7 million cost 
of the special session is just 
the tip of the iceberg for 
redistricting. "The cost in 
2001 to get the existing plan 
in force was $7 million. 
Texas could spend nearly 
that much defending the 
proposed plan in federal 
courts. And this plan will be 
challenged." 

Call Margaret with all your 
local news and upcoming 
events at 854-10.08 or 254- 
629-1701 or fax your news 

to 254-629-2092 
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Source: www.tic.state.ts.uslreseafch/rethst/rechslistm 	 ' Joshua Cobb/Repo. i(T New 

(Borrowed from Reporter-News) 

Several senators —
Republican and Democrat —
say they cannot support the 
House map because it 
divides some communities 
and could eliminate key rural 
members of Congress. 

State Sen. Troy Fraser, R-
Horseshoe Bay, said his goal 
is to preserve the existing 
West Texas districts as much 
as possible. Fraser represents 
Eastland and Callahan 
Counties among others. 

"I'd like the district 
Abilene is in to remain a lot 
like it is as Abilene is the 
dominant city," Fraser said. 
"The truth is, I think 
Republicans are comfortable 
with the district it stands 
today. They feel strongly that 
they will do well in the next 

Blood And Water Drive To Be 
July 23 At Clyde Post Office 

Wit's End Shop and Cafe 

Every nook and cranny of Wit's End is filled 
with something delightful. 

Wit's End Is Charming 
Inside And Out 

By Margaret Hetrick 
One of the nice things 

about Baird are the various 
eating 	establishments 
throughout the town. 

I have already written 

about the Whistle.  Stop Cafe 
on Market Street, which is a 
very popular stop for locals as 
well as tourist taking a stroll 
through the downtown area. 
continued 

The Fifth Annual Golf 
Tournament sponsored by 
Baird Chamber of 
Commerce is scheduled 
Saturday, July 19th. 

Entry fee for the two 
person scramble at Shady 
Oaks Golf Course is $30 
per person plus cart and 
green fee. 

There will be prizes for 
tournament winners and hot 
dog/burger 	supper 
following the tournament, 
according to Susan McCool 
who is chairing the 
tournament. 

MI 	 
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OBITUARIES 
Reo F. Jolly 

CLYDE- Reo F. Jolly, 87, of 
Eula died Sunday, July 6, 
2003 at his home. 

Services were held Tuesday, 
July 8, 2003 at 2 p.m. at the 
Eula Methodist Church, C. 
Lee Smith and Rev. Bob 
Karlin officiated. Burial was 
in the Eula Cemetery directed 
by Bailey Funeral Home. 

Reo was born December 18, 
1915 to Marion and Bettie 
Cole on the Kennard Ranch 
outside of Clyde. He attended 
school in Eula, Clyde and 
Lone Oak graduating from 
Baird High School in 1933. 
He married Nellie Sith on 
August 24, 1935 in Abilene. 
He served as Callahan Co. 
Precinct 1 Democratic Chair-
man and Election Judge for 
over 60 years. He was a mem-
ber of the Eula Baptist 
Church. 

He was preceded in death 
by one brother Marshall Jolly; 
two sisters, Maude Hannaford 
and Alta Jolly and one son-in- 

law James Massengale. 
Survivors are his wife 

Nellie; two daughters, Fran 
Massengale and Lela Rose 
and her husband Charles Dick 
all of Abilene; two brothers, 
Forrest Jolly of Arcadia, Ok. 
and Grady B. Jolly of 
Abilene; one sister, Pearl 
Edwards of Clyde; four 
grandchildren and their 
spouses, Lorri and Kyle 
Routh, Philip and Tanya 
Massengale, Liana and Steve 
Poole, Denise and Doug 
Scales; nine great-grandchil-
dren, Leslie Nixon, Matt 
Routh, Justin Scales, Abby 
Massengale, Kari Routh, 
Kelli Routh, Cody Scales, 
Harley Poole, and Gracie 
Poole. 

Memorials may be made to 
Hospice of the Big Country, 
4601 Hartford, Abilene, TX 
79605 or Eula Cemetery As-
sociation in care of Rose 
Farmer 5930 FM 603 Clyde, 
TX 79510. 

CROSS PLAINS - Joe 
David Ingram, 74, died 
Friday, July 11, 2003 at Scott 
and White Hospital in 
Temple, Texas after a 15 year 
battle with cancer. 

Funeral services were held 
at 2:00 p.m. Monday, July 14, 
2003 at First Baptist Church 
with Ronnie White officiating 
and Burlie Taylor assisting. 

Mr. Ingram was born 
February 5, 1929 in Cross 
Plains, to W. H. (Bill) and 
Althea Ingram. He married 
Wesley B. Profitt on January 
21, 1950 in Phillips, Texas. 

Joe worked for Phillips 
Petroleum for 17 years in 
Phillips, Texas before 
returning to Cross Plains, 
wherehe was a farmer and 
rancher. He also served as 
Callahan 	County 
Commissioner for two terms 
and several years on the Cross 
Plains City Council. 

He is survived by Wesley, 
his wife of 53 years; four 
daughters and sons-in-law, 
Patsy and John Moran of 
Abilene; Sherry and Brad 
Harris of Lexingon, KY, 
Barbara and Donnie Dillard 
of Cross Plains, Edith and 
Rex Beggs of Cross Plains; a 
sister, Wanda Tyler of Eula; 
two brothers, Mike Ingram of 
Mammoth Lakes, CA and 
Mack Ingram of Richmond, 
Texas; 12 grandchildren, nine 
grri.1.-§opdg4-9.6 as well 
as a latge*retaiedfamiN and 
a host of friends. 

He was preceded in death 
by his parents; and two 
sisters, Willie Mae Ingrain 
and Bonnie Ingram. 

Honoring their grandfather 
as pallbearers are his 
grandsons, Elvan Goode, Jr., 
Donnie Dillard, Jr., John 
Moran, Jr., Tony Beggs, 
Joseph Dillard, Bo Harris. 
Honorary pallbearers include, 
Irwin Clark, Franzelle Odom, 
Arvin Brashear, and R. C. 
Merryman. 

Memorial may be made to 
the Cross Plains EMS; First 
Baptist Church; or the 
American Cancer Society. 

Letter To The Editor 

Dear Editor: 
This is Joint Petition No. 

1 for the following: 
The Honorable George W. 

Bush, President of the 
United States of America; 

The Honorable Kay B. 
Hutchison, Texas Senator; 

The Honorable John 
Cornyn, Texas Senator; 

The Honorable Charles 
Stenholm, U.S. Representa-
tive of the 17th District; 

We humbly pray that you 
shall use an extra amount of 
discernment with this Peti-
tion. 

Patrick Henry said that the 
Bible is worth all other 
books which have ever been 
printed. 

George Washington said, 
"It is impossible to rightly 
govern people without God 
and the Bible." He also 
warned against becoming 
entangled with foreign na-
tions. Since we believe that 
George Washington knew 
more about what is best for 
this nation than some of our 
present leaders, especially.  
the Supreme Court, we want 
enactment of the four fol- 

Monday, July 14, 2003 
organization; moreover the 
money which is spent on the 
UN could be used better at 
home. 

Sincerely, 
Jim Hicks 

1290 FM 604 N 
Clyde, TX 79510 
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31 We Do•e't Nava 3t — We Oa" Oat 7iff 4 
929 East Main in Eastland 

254-629-2026 	 AL 

82002 Mercury Sable 2 to choose from (red or white, . 

At under factory warranty) 	 $10,900 
1,2001 Ford Taurus V-6, 38,000 k, very cean 	$8900 41't; 

;2000 Ford Contour, V6, very nice 	 $5850 4 
A. 

41997 F-250 S/Cab, 4x4, must see (extra clean).$6995 I 
:2000 Ford -150 S/Cab XLT, 5.4 V8, loaded 	I 

401/2 Ton.  	 $13,900 4 

4411-4H1H8*+++41144+4SAH14-41"84-41"0 

For Your Computer Hardware & Software Needs 

H. G. Henderson 
915-677-9125 

(Soon to be 325-677-9125) 

Best Equipment * Best Prices 

P. 0. Box 398 

Joe Ingram 

1304 E. Main 
Eastland 

Avi T. Deshmukh, M.D., F.A.C.S. 
Board Certified in Urology 

Frank V. Terrell, M.D. 
Da-Thuy Van, D.O. 

General Ophthalmology & Ophthalmic Surgery 

Eastland Memorial Hospital 

For Appointment call 

(254) 629-2601 
254-629-3363 

Grandpaw's 
Tool Shed Rental, Inc. 

Attention Farmers! Pasture aeration time is here. 
For strong roots and healthy field grasses, come 
by Grandpaw's Tool Shed Rental and rent our 
Lawson Aerator for your pasture today. Stop by 
or call 254-629-3363 to find out more about the 
aerator and our many other types of equipment. 

lowing resolutions: 
1. The right for unre-

stricted Christian prayer in 
our public schools. 

2. "One nation under God" 
kept in the pledge to the flag. 

3. The right to read and/or 
teach the Bible in our pub-
lic schools. 

4. Since the United Na-
tions is controlled by terror-
ist, atheist, heathen, pagan, 
dictator, and communist 
countries; and also since one 
of the UN's main objectives 
is to confiscate all of our per-
sonal guns, and also that the 
majority of the members of 
the UN have no reason to tell 
the truth, we believe that we 
should withdraw from that 

	 r.t41 —al Custom Homes - Remodeling - Commercial - Industrial - Farm 
IMF 	"'Financing - Free Estimates - Design, Engineering & Plan Services 

s-104 

IT. J. CLARK CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 
(254) 734-2755 

P. 0. Box 176 111 E. Roberts St. 
Gorman, TX 76454 

CUSTOM HOME BUILDERS 
SINCE 1980 

General Building Contractors - All Work Guaranteed 

-Lei" Us Build Youw,New Ijome 
or Room Addition 

If You Can Dream It, We Can Build It! 

5-104.  Abilene, TX 

d1111111."—...01111111110J_.../11w„miE11111111=1111111......miallow'lll 

It's Your Money... 
...and we can help you keep more of it. By finding every 
tax deduction and tax credit you're entitled to take. By 
suggesting strategies that will minimize your tax liability 
each and every year. Call for an appointment today. 

Cam Gulley, CPA 
935 E. Main - Eastland, TX 

254-629-8901 

1141"17.•4 
4k_LT 9   

CHIROPRACTIC 
FOR BETTER HEALTH 

STEPHEN G. BARRY D.C. CHIROPRACTOR 

LIVE AND LEARN AND PASS IT ON 
"Our lives begin to end the day we become silent about things that matter" 

--Martin Luther King, Jr 

Good health improves your quality of life. Millions have found chiropractic care to be 
the•treatment of choice for their headaches, back pain, or injuries following automobile, 
athletic or work related accidents. To schedule an appointment call 629-1771. 

Office hours: Monday - Friday 8-12; 2-6 
(Closed Thursday afternoon) 

Medicare, Auto/Health Insurance, Work Comp. Accepted 

BARRY CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 
961 E. Main • Eastland, TX • 254-629-1771 • 

19th & 1-20 Cisco, Texas 
Shop (254) 442-4262 Home (254) 442-2578 Mobile (817) 999-5272 

OPEN SATURDAYS 10-2 	• 

BARGAIN OF THE MON H 
2000 Chevy Cavalier 
2 door, auto, extra nice 	 $49S0 

89 Dodge Dakota V6, auto, ail.  	 $2300 
$1500 

97 Saturn 5 speed, 4 dr., air, 1- M/FM, cassette 	 $250 

97 Ford Crown Victoria LX fully loaded, 69,000 mi 	$5995 

99 Plymouth Voyager Loaded, 55K 	  
00 Chevy S10 4 cyl., 5 speed, air, AM/FM, 29K 	 $5995 

00 Ford F150 6 cyl., 5 sp., short bed, Sport, (Red), 52K 	$7450 

30 Ford F150 XL long bed, 6 cyl., 5 sp., air, AM/FM, CD, 
56k 	 $6450 

00 Buick Century loaded 	 $5950 

00 Saturn SL2 4 dr., auto, air, AM/FM, cass 	 $5995 
00 Mercury Mystique fully loaded, extra nice,67K 	$4995 
01 Ford Taurus SE fully loaded, 55K 	 $7550 

U. S. Government Cars 
90 Dodge 3/4 Ton, auto 	 $2100 

$2950 
99 Plymouth Breeze (green), auto, air, AM/FM, 49K 	$5950 
00 Ford Contour SE, 4 dr., loaded, (white), 67K 	 $450.0 
00 Ford Contour SE, 4 dr., loaded, (red), 52K 	 $5250 

00 Ford Taurus SE, 4 dr., loaded, (red), 62K 	 $6450 

92 Chevy Caprice 4 dr., auto air 	 

94 Plymouth Acclaim 4 dr., auto, air, AM/FM, 23K 	  

L 



	1 
Starshine 

Greetings from Windy Hill! 

This is not usually what I am 
sending this time of 
morning, but it seems clear 
that it will be some time (if 
ever) before I send any 
more. columns. 
So, this is a heartfelt "Thank 
You" for those of you who 
have borne patiently (as far 
as I know) with my 
nit-picking about my "stuff." 
And I am aware that I get 
pretty pickish at times. You 
are appreciated, whether 
we've ever met or not. 
My email address is 
worthy@big 	planet.com. 
Feel free to use it any time. 
Julia Worthy 
7-14-03 

Read The Classifieds 

1999 Mercury 
Sable GS 

A... 

$7,990 
• 2003 Pontine 
I 	V% 01 

.r wlek, 
K1334 

$ 15 990 
2000 Ford 

F.150 Quad Cab 

2001 Chrysler PT 
Cruise Umliod 

Manx;, Bch',  

$14,990 
2002 Chevy 

Blazer LS 

$17,990 
2001 Ford I•150 

Quad Cab 
4.t,l/C, 

$12,990 
2001 Fo 
Taurus SIS 

R 	Wrvli 
K ,VA 

$9,990 

.., k-.440.mtwatar.ar 
2000 Ford 

1.150 Quad Cab 
of 41, no Act, 

lanA 

$15,990 
1999 Ford 
Escort LX 

A.. 

$4,990 
2000 Ford 
1.150 S/C 

vi,kt 01 
40I7S" 

$ 15,990 
2002 Dodge 

Neon 
4 1) 	A.- il( 

2001 Ford 
Taurus SI 
A.t, 70.41 

iGlie 

$10,990 
2001 Ford 

F.350 Crew Cab 
• 

2002 Dodge 
Stratus 

Door, 	faary Warn 

$11:090 

2000 Mercury 
Cougar 

$12,495 

1989 Chevy 
Reg Cab 

cc  s 

$4,990 
1999 Chevy 

5.10 Rog Cob 

13 

$6,990 

2000 Ford 
Mustang LX Coupe 

Pear Sra 
4Q? 

$10,990 
1999 Dodge 

Dl SOO Reg Cab 

$8 ,490 

0 

 

2000 Ford 
F-I50 Quad Cab 

51t3 4.; 01 
;G:•3: 

 

2001 Ford 
F.150 S/C 
A.v 	W4nret, 

K.0.52 

$17,990 

 

 

$16,990 
1996 Fordo250 

Rog  
S sew Vi 

$9,990 

   

   

2002 Mercury 
Sable GS 

 

    

2002 Ford 
F-150 Super Crew 

$20,990 

 

2002 Ford 1.150 
Super Crew 

01,1 
411 

  

$20,990 

 

2000 Pontiac 
Grand Am 

q 

$9,990 

2001 Ford 
F-130 RC 

xl.fw ft 

/ 1 990 

2000 Ford 
F-350 Quad Cab 

2001 Ford 
F.250 Crew 
rovv.isir, 41, 

4616/ 

$28,990 
1999 Ford 

Ranger S/C 

$8,990 

2003 FORD RANGER 
Cash Price $22250 
Dealer Disc 	$2,920 
Rebate 	 $3,000 

Cash Price $17,280 
Dealer Disc 	$2,205 
Rebate 	 $3,000 

2002 Ford 
F-I 50 S/C 4x4 

5416 A.. 

$21,990 
2001 Ford 

Rti,,trFwRi C  
40.114 

$8,990 

2000 Ford 
F.150 S/C 4x4 

At kt, 
FGI:7 

$16,990 
2002 Ford 

Explorer XLT 

$ 18,990 
2001 Ford 

F-150 Reg Cab 
o- l.1 

$12,990 

2001 Ford 
Taurus SIS 

rl,F4ory %Ivry 
KIKA 

$9,990 

2003 Ford 
Ranger Edge 

S 	Inn,F1 
16i3 

$ 15,990 

2000 Chevy 
C1500 Re? Cab 

46'43 

$9,990 
2001 Om 

Trailblazer LS 
4Ctv FiKoke 

KIXA 

$19,990 

00 FORD MUSTANG CONY 
LX, AUTO, RED, #R3504A 

01 FORD ESCORT SE 
4 DOOR, AUTO, FACTORY WARRANTY. 40182 

01 FORD RANGER R/C 
XLT, TILT, CRUISE, AUTO, #0186 

00 PONTIAC GRAND AM 
V6, AUTO, #C360A 

••seEpeAt,en FOR MAILS Jobi@rondotpirfOrd.cont 

A free, all-day Regional 
Workshop for community 
leaders, preservationists, 
students and interested 
citizens will be presented by 
the Texas Historical 
Commission (THC) on 
Wednesday, August 13. 

The Workshop - Celebrat-
ing Our History - is from 
8:30 a.m. - 3.30 p.m. (Regis-
tration at 8 a.m.) in the Kemp 
Center for the Arts, 1300 
Lamar, Wichita Falls,TX. 

The THC invites interested 
persons to join the staff and 
guest speakers for a full day 
of learning and sharing infor-
mation about promoting pres-
ervation in your community. 
The program emphasized is-
sues specific to Central and 
West Central Texas. 

Workshop hi-lights include 
a Welcome by Wichita Falls 
Mayor Bill Altman and the 
THC Executive Director 
Larry Oaks, a Keynote by 
Doug Harman, President and 
CEO of the Fort Worth Con-
vention and Visitors Bureau, 
How to Save a Historic Build-
ing, Texas Historical Markers, 
Downtown Revitalization/ 
Better the Second Time 
Around, Archeology Stew-
ards/Historic Texas Lands 
Plaque Program, Grant Writ-
ing 101, Optional local tour 
of historic downtown Wichita 
Falls, Optional afternoon (4 
p.m.) guilded tour of the 
nearby historic Archer 
County Courthouse currently 
undergoing restoration. 

Celebrate the THC's 50th 
anniversary during 	I si  

As your contribution to the 
50th anniversary celebration, 
please bring photographs, 
news clippings and other me-
mentos that represent the his-
tory of preservation efforts in 
your community or organiza-
tion. During the workshop, 
we will pin these items to a 
Forts/Hill Country Region 
memory board. You may take 
home your items at the end of 
the workshop. 

This event is free, but res-
ervations are requested. A 
charge of $8 will be made for 
lunch. 

For more information or 
reservation forms, contact 
Jennifer Haisten at 1-800/ 
799-6732 or 940/716-5500. 

A block of rooms is re-
served at the Radisson Hotel, 
100 Central Freeway, Wichita 
Falls, 940-776-1730. Please 
reference the Texas Historical 
Commission workshop to re-
ceive the special room rate of 
$70 for Tuesday, August 12, 
on a first come, for served 
basis. For other accommoda-
tions, call the Wichita Falls 
Convention and Visitors Bu-
reau at 1-800/799-6732. 

Callahan County (Baird) Star 

Texas Historical 
Commission To 
Hold Workshop 

r' I 

Monday, July 14, 2003 
( 

Department of Defense 
announces new Combat- 
Related 	Special 
Compensation 

The Department of 
Defense, working together 
with the Department of 
Veterans Affairs, 	has 
announced the start of a new 

compensation program for 
many disabled military 
retirees,' Combat-Related 
Special Compensation 
(CRSC). 

	

The 	new 	special 
compensation becomes 
effective May 31, 2003, for 
qualified combat-related 
disabled retirees. Payments 
for qualified retirees will 
accrue beginning June 1, 
2003, with first payments 
possible on July 1, 2003. 

Eligible members are those 
retirees who have 20 years of 
service for retired pay 
compensation and who either 
have disabilities because of 
combat injuries for which 
they have been awarded the 
Purple Heart or who are rated 
at least 60 percent disabled 
because of armed conflict, 
hazardous duty, training 
exercises, or mishaps 
involving military equipment. 

Members must apply to 
their own branch of service 
using :DD Form 2860, 
"Application for Combat- 

	

Related 	Special 
Compensation (CRSC)." The 
application form is available 
from the Defense Manpower 
Data Center Website at http:/  

/www.dmdc.osd.mil/crsc/ 
Your Callahan County 

Veterans Service Office will 
have the application forms 
and other information on the 
new program. A call to 325-
854-1520 on Mondays and 
Tuesdays will get copies in 
the mail to you. It appears to 
be well worth the time for 
those who are eligible. 

Korean War 
On July 5, 1950, Pvt 

Kenneth Shadrick of Skin 
Fork, West Virginia, became 
the first U. S. serviceman to 
die in the Korean War. Think 
of him and all the others who 
died in that terrible war when 
you observe the Armistice 
which came about fifty years 
ago on July 27, 1953. 

TAPS 
Each day the papers carry 

news of more buddies who 
have answered the last call. 
Our area is no exception and 
we are saddened to know the 
loss of Dr. Robert V. Bailey, 
Jr., USN born in Clyde, Frank 
Bartek, USA Cross Plains, 
William Brannon, USA Eula, 
DuWayne L. (D.L.) Clark, 
USAF. Clyde, J. R. 
Poindexter, USA Oplin, and 
Lyle Ancell, USAF Clyde, a 
good friend to so many. Our 
condolences are extended to 
the families of these Veterans, 
men who served their country 
well. 
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Fac Rebate 	 $2.000 

2000 Ford F.150 
Quad Cob 

<PA 

$13,990 

2001 Ford 
Expedition XLT 

$20,990 

00 MERCURY COUGAR 
V6, AUTO, LEATHER, 4195 

News For Veterans 

STK# C213 	 STK# 0417 

c' Ew X2 	g $31 944*cREw$34P  900* 4  
4X4 	Cash Price ... $41,1955 
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STIR C331 
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9 CAB 	

Cash Price ... $36,475 
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2002 lord F.250 
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$28,990 

REDIT PROB 
NO P BLEM • 
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02 MERCURY SABLE GS 
PW, PL, T/C, FACTORY 

WARRANTY, #G161 

SUPER CAB, STK# C404 

16,330* 
REG CAB, STK# C370 

2,075* 

2002 Ford 
Taurus SIS 

A. 	le Man, 
6210 

$11,990 

CALL 1-800-749-1616 ASK FOR MR. GREEN! 
••( 

SEEK  AND  FIND 
FIND THESE WORDS IN THE PUZZLE BELOW. 

BEANS 
BURRITOS 
CHEESE 
ENCHILADA 

THE WORDS READ UP: DOWN AND ACROSS. 

FAJITAS 
GUACAMOLE 
JALAPENOS 
NACHOS 

QUESADILLA 
RICE 
TACO 
TORTILLA 

WGUACAMOLE 
ASBURR I TOS 
TACOFDI3FTG 
RJALAPENOS 
ILEKJ JAHRO 
CPSOI INUTH 
EEERTTSYIC 
QUESADILLA 
ZCHVSNTYLN 
ENCHILADAW 

We Clean The Most Neglected, 
Unsanitary Part Of Your Home: 

YOUR AIR DUCT SYSTEM!  
J & J Air Conditioning, Inc. 

106 Pogue Eastland, TX 
254-629-2251 TACLB00200C 800-585-2251 

V8, AUTO, XLT, ALUM WHEELS 
• • • .... 

FORT WORTH 

1-20 
Open M-F Sam-7:30pm, Sat 8am-5pm 

Service Hours M-F 8am-6pm, Sat 8am-Noon 

ABILENE 

HWY 183 & 1-20 • CISCO, TEXAS 

ci?o•ir,Ce 

Dealer Disc , S3.040  4X2XLTS2 0 57 5 Cash Price S25.615 

Rebate 	$3,000 	STK# 

2001 Dodge 
D1500 Quad 
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ncLoiptlaii  edified 

in CI5COw  TX 
[1?7® OGoah7G,oa LAtt)27327a)®&)Gigg 	or, 

airiP ® 	anaG)>Qov C3Sa2 affiT7. 01W0G,MaK40 oa VCM Du® 00T0 1217g  	 

2003 FORD F-250 2003 FORD F-150 SUPER CREW/ 
/1/11.0 	G 	D.JUL, AUTO, LS AXLE 	 • r• 

k 	

, 

$7,4,1,$23,15 isaiherr413:Z • ...- "7, Rebate 	$2.500 

itt$27,615163,,F'DtE 

2003 FORD F-150 UPER CAB 
Cash Price 

Ts3,0002i 	sr4X02c3X11.8  
P.1 6 9  81 7* 

1998 Ford 
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2001 Ford 
F-ISO Quad Cab 

s 	III 

 

1997 Chevy 
C2500 S/C 4x4 

A.t 

$9,990 

..11)1111 WEST TEXAS ..• 	1999 JeeGrand 
Cherokee SLT 
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5500 Down, 60 Mos.@ 
248
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5.9% WAC 

Sale Price $12,495 TT81. 

02 FORD F.150 STEPSIDE 
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$500   
220.0 
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01 FORD IF-150 
QUAD CAA, STEPSIDE, AUTO, 

#C374A 

$500 Down,624 w60A  cMos.@Sale pri c3e$125.4.:: 

$500 Down, 72 Mos.@ 	MO  
7• 99% WAD Sale Price 313,989 nu 

2002 FORD F.150 QUAD CAI 
AUTO, FACTORY WARRANTY, 

CD, #C2178 

5500 Down, 72 Mos.@ 289m0 
5.75% WAD Sale Price 515,879 + TTE 

S500 Down, 66 Mos.@ 134,00 
5.9% WAC 

Sale Price 57,490 + T181. 

01 FORD F.150 SUPER CREW 
XLT, V8, AUTO, T/C, #0206 

$500 Down, 72 mos @ 349M0 
6.99% WAC 

Sale Price 518,779 • TT&L 

5500pown.6omos.@ 199mo  
5.99% WAD 

Sale Price 59,579 + TT&L 

02 FORD ESCORT SE 
TILT, CRUISE, P WINDOWS, P LOCKS. 
AUTO, FACTORY WARRANTY, #6158 

S500 Down, 60 Mos.@ .1 9  9 MO 
4.75% WAC 

Sale Price 59,149 • Tr8L 

5500 Down, 60 Mos.@ 197mo 
5.9% WAC 

Sale Price $9,990 + TT81. 

99 DODGE D1 500 
REG CAB, V8, #C4 06A 

S500 Down, 60 Mos @ 1 89mo 
6 99% WAC 

Sale Price 58,496 + TIM. 

A dog's sense of smell Is 
about a thousand times bet-
ter than a person's. 

1-800-749-1616 
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Vinyl,Skling.• Soffit Over Hang Coverage • Metal Roofing 
• Replacement Windows • Seamless Gutters 

50 YR. LIFETIME GUARANTEE 	MEMBER BBB 

A-1 9-Come lmyrovements 
Local 254-639-2212 

100% Financing W.A.C. 
No Down Payment 

	

r 	 9 

	

1 	JULY SPECIAL 1  
. 20% OFF DISCOUNT on . 

	

Call For Fee Estimates 1 	 i 1 
Donald Hale 	 I 

Toll Free: 1-866-784-8257B52 

. white vinyl siding. FREE . 

254-433-0396 

	

I 	French patio replacement 
 

1
L
oor or 2 sets of window shutters' 
	  .1 

C SIMONTON 
- Profin.itle 

Callahan County (Baird) Star 

Reich Reunion To Be July 20 
The a4rgal Reich reunion 

will be held on Sunday, July 
20, 2003 at the Redeemer 
Luthern Parish Hall: 

Aldolph Reich and his wife 
Matilda were both born in 
Baranvo, Germany and were 
married. thjtre on June 15, 
1882. Cthespitwas also born 
there. ,On Nov. 4, 1884 they 
came to Arp.sric. They were 
one of, t10, first German im-
migrantV to locate in the 
Cisco are'd'where they lived 
and raised their thirteen chil-
dren. 

Children, grandchildren, 
nieces, nephews, cousins, all 
descendautli of Adolph and 

t  Matilda ROO will gather for 
a potluck dinner and fellow-
ship at 12 noon. They will 

share pictures and memories 
of their German heritage and 
the blessings and freedoms 
they have since their ances-
tors so bravely migrated to 
the new world. 

Vicar Keith Reich, a great 
grandson of the late Adolph 
and Matilda Reich will be 
conducting the morning wor-
ship service at 10:30 a.m. 
with Sunday School and 
Bible class beginning at 9:30. 

Vicar Reich, son of Harold 
and Vernell Reich and his 
wife, Stacy, daughter of 
Baylis and Judy Pope, along 
with their 3 sons Reagan, 
Jonathon and Riley are stay-. 
ing in Cisco this summer un-
til he assumes his vicarage 
duties in Hamilton, Tx. on 
July 21, 2003. 

James Scott Is Spring 
Graduate Of Texas A&M 

COLLEGE STATION - 
Diplonias)were awarded to 
approximately 5,000 Texas 
A&M UniVersity graduates 
during spring commencement 
ceremonies. 

Among' those recognized 

were: 
James Caleb Scott of 

Baird, Bachelor Of Science 
Agricultural Economics 

Remember To Renew 
Your Subscription 

Monday, July 14, 2003 
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HARPERSVILLE 

MUSIC FESTIVAL© 

 

Summer Sounds 
Coming To Harpersville 

Music Festival 
By Lindsay Meeks 
The Harpersville Music 

Festival will kick off Au- 
gust 8th and will continue 
on through the weekend 
until the 10th as some of 
most talented songwriters 
of Texas and the neighbor-
ing states entertain crowds 
with their melodies. 

The event was planned as 
a farewell to summer and 
introduction to the exciting 
artists and the June Leland 
Wildlife Foundation (the 
organization sponsoring the 
event.) All of the festivities 
are to raise money for the 
threatened. Lesser Prairie 
Chicken while bringing 
families and friends to-
gether to listen to music and 
have a good time. 

Jack Williams will set the 
mood of the event as the 
host and will be followed 
by award winning acts like 
Gary P. Nunn, Kevin 
Welch, Tish Hinojosa, 
Trout Fishing in America, 
Sisters Morales, Jimmy 

LaFave, Lloyd Maines; and 
the young rising group, the 
South Austin Jug Band. Sun- 
day, the show will start early 
(at noon) with a song service 
featuring the blues music and 
eight piece band of Kay Kay 
and the Rays. 

Camping is encouraged on 
the 600-acre ranch and is free 
with the purchase of three-
day advance tickets. The 
campsites are furnished with 
restroom and shower facili-
ties. 

Ticket prices are $15 Fri-
day and Saturday and $25 on 
Saturday if purchased by 
mail or on-line ahead of time. 
For all three days, the price 
per ticket is $49 and includes 
camping and children under 
12 free. Tickets may be pur-
chased at the gate during the 
festival for an additional $5 
per ticket or all three days for 
$60. Visa and MasterCard are 
accepted. 

For more information 
about the festival, go on-line 
a 
www.harpersvillemusic.com 
or call toll free at 1-866-631-
0705. Come join the fun! 

San Angelo 
5r1i 	30.0(Tifi 
r....,t,•••••••-‘1 • 

Wichita Falls 

Festival Site 
10 miles south of 
Breckenridge on Hwy 183 

Breckenridge 

Graham 
Ft. Worth 

Dallas 
Abilene 

Eastland 

HwY• 6 

Brownwood Waco IIIIIMINENTnew-mmaf,  

• -.3 J-f€110,116 CORSTRUCT1011 
Game, Cattle, and Residential 

Satisfaction 
Guarantied 

5-62 

Call Bill Johnson 
254-433-0381 
WE DO FREE ESTIMATES 

11. 	'Ili :1111111113 A  iimm13 wftwomil mmirmett  

EASTLAND MEMORIAL HOSPITAL 
"People you know caring for people you love" 

Cornerstone of Medical Central 

304 Si Daugherty St. 	Eastland, Texas 	254-629-2601 

CARPET! CARPET! CARPET! 
Carpet • Linoleum • Tile • Ceramic Tile 

Wood Flooring • Wallpaper • Mini Blinds 

Choose your carpet from over 1,000 samples and have 
it installed by our trained in-house installers. 

Get that custom finished look with matching 
wallpaper and custom fitted mini-blinds. 

Austin's Furniture 
194.&pleol-kt& CSItote; 

510 Conrad Hilton Cisco, Texas 442-2533 

"TSTC offers many programs of study, so making 
a career change wasn't a hard decision." 

"With the financial assistance I received, going 
to college was very affordable." 

"With TSTC located right 
here, attending class is easy." 

"I learned about TSTC from my friends. They 
said it was a great choice." 

Plans that f" 
—4'4077gam,vror.,".  et:EE NOKIA or CONY 

phone + access, with a new 
activation. New "Unlimited" 

Airtime & "Unlimited" 
Long Distance local plan, 

only $44.99 mo. 
Free nights, weekends, 
& mobile to mobile - 

on most plans. 
Come by and see your NEW 

local dealer today! 
tILIVRY 	lit.111ED I llak OFFEri 

ESTERN CELLULAR 
1331 Suite B East Main 

Eastland, TX 76448 

(254) 629-8662 Phone (254) 629-8672 Fax 

Somes and conditions apply. See store for details 

Across from Randolph Dodge 	 5.63 

CELLULAR° 11111E1 www.cenoneusa 
 term 

.com 

Lakeside Country Club 
Guys and Dolls Results 

Lakeside Country, Club 	The Third Flight was won 
hosted thqr Guys & Dolls by Harold and Helen 
Tournament on July 5-6, Tilghman with 148, Second 
2003. Thirty-two teams par- was Rick Mannke and Elaine 
ticipated in the 2-day tour- Clark with 149, Third was Pat 
nament and the 'players and Donna Hogan with 150, 
were served pork chops, Third was Hank Smith and 
macaroni salad, green beans Jamie Thomas with 151, 
and apple cobbler on Satur- Fourth was Lanny Hand and 
day night. The Closest to Pat Byrd with 152 and Fifth 
the Pin was won by Dan was Rod Straw and Pam Tho-
Scott from Stephenville. mas with 153. 
The Men's Most Accurate 	The Fourth Flight was won 
Drive was won by Russell by Russell Walker and Vickie 
Walker and the Women's Driscoll with 153, Second 
Most Accurate Drive was was Dickie Zarfas and Roxie 
won by Karol Matlock from Penn with 156, Third was 
Fort Worth. 	 Dale and Pam Wilson with 

The Championship Flight 158 and Fourth was Buddy 
was won by Barry and Bird and Evett Pundt with 
Sharon Fletcher with 125, 158. 
Second was Tom Broom The Fifth Flight was won by 
and Sherry Bowden with Jack and Linda Straw with 
127, Third was Bob and 156, Second was Dan and 
Donna McCoy with 137 Pam Scott with 158, Third 
and Fourth was Eddie and was Ronnie and Mickey 
Kery Clay with 139. 	Edwards with 162, Fourth 

The First Flight was won was Ken and Sammie Blades 
by Randy and Nancy Har- with 164 and Fifth was 
ris with 138, Second was Chance Bruno and Julie 
David McCoy with Sylvia Sharp with 171. 
Snook with 138, Third was 	The next tournament will be 
Eddie and Jan Clay with the Cliff Beck 2-Man Low-
139, Fourth was Sam Ball on August 9-10, 2003. 
Rodriguez and Karol The entry fee will be $120.00 
Matlock with 140, Fifth per team. For more informa-
was Jason Hutt and Lori tion call 254-629-2892. 
Whatley with 140 and Fifth 
was Ronnie and Jean Hicks 
with 147. 

The Second Flight was 
won by Joe and Lana 
Johnson with 142, Second 
was Judd Duncan and 
Christy Potts with 143, 
Third was Lonnie and Myra 
Gaylor with 144, Fourth 

foe 'and 'M'aVii He9sert 
with 145, Jerry Dudley and" 
Delores Tankersley with 
145, and Larry and Maria 
Duncan with 145 and Fifth 
was Ron and Georgia 
Gibson with 147. 

Remember to 
Renew Your 

Subscription. 
Check the 
due date at 

the top of your 
mailing label. 



John's Travel 
Notebook... 

John C. Jones 
Travel/Food Writer 
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Jeff Burrow 
Foundation Repair 

Family Owned Since 1962 
0 

BBB 

/AMU 
AWN 

Steel Reinforced oncrete iers 
915-673-8782 

Toll Free 1-877-883-8391 
Slab Repair • Pier & Beam Repair 

Credit Cards Accepted • Free Estimate 
See per M in the, .?0,s, Yellow Pages 

BI -RITE AUTO of Light on 254-725-7361 
Closed Fridays Hiway 

THIS WEEK'S SPECIALS 
95 Olds Achieva good condition, Was $2595 	 $2195 
95 Taurus 4 dr., good cond, very nice, Was $2595 	 $2195 
94 Mercury Sable V6, cold air, Was $2585 	 $2195 
94 Taurus V6, cold air, looks, runs good, Was $2450 $1995 
87 Buick LaSabre looks, runs good, Was $995 	 $695 

OTHER AUTOS VANS - TRUCKS 
98 Ford Contour SE, 4 dr., V6, automatic, cold air, new tires, 

go first class 	 Only $3450 
88 Chevy Suburban runs & drives very good 	 $500 Down 
94 Ford F 350 diesel, runs very good, steel flatbed 	 $2450 
92 Taurus S. Wagon, runs good 	 $500 Down 
92 Mercury Sable S. Wagon, good cond 	 $600 Down 
90 Aerostar Van, V6, 3 seats, very nice van 	 $750 Down 
89 Cadillac Sedan DeVille, runs good, cold air 	 $395 Down 
Mt ord qcop,Nm5vi„ lookl, runs golird 	.g.1  u.t. 1...".9.q4295 Down 
98 Ford Ratter W61:kffio, CIA air; high miles 	'  '  $1750 Down 
89 Mercury Grand'Marquis,super clean Was $1895 	$1795 
99 Ford Ranger Supercab, V6, 5 sp., fancy wheels, etc., 53k miles 
Was $6995 	 $5995 

WE BUY - SELL - TRADE 

Cross Plains 4argcmirr 
36 

CJC's Dinner Theatre To Present 	TWC Approves Allocation "Guys and Dolls" July 17-20, 24-27 
For WCTWD Board 

Monday, July 14, 2003 

The Elegant Sawgrass 
Marriott Resort 

There she is, rising up from 
the 4,800 acre of luxurious 
landscape surrounding her- 
the elegantly appointed 
Sawgrass Marriott Hotel of 
Ponte Verdra Beach, Florida. 
Here is a resort that will spoil 
you for anything else- it has 
all the amenities for those 
who except excellence. 
"Charm and grandeur" of 
hand in hand with "fun and. 
activities" at this gilded re-
sort. As I walked into the 
lobby where the seventy-foot 
breathtaking atrium engulfs 
me- a look up reveals an in- 
credibly mammoth skylight, 
and I have just started to re-
alize the extraordinary expe-
riences that will be unfold-
ing. From the lobby looking 
out at the picturesque 13th 
hole of the TPC at Sawgrass 
Stadium Course makes your 
wait for tee-time tomorrow 
seem even further away! 

From Jacksonville take I-
95 South to 9A an onto St. 
Johns Bluff Blvd. and when 
you end at AlA turn south 
three and a half miles to the 
resort. It is only about thirty 
five minutes from the airport. 

This elegant resort offers 
the golfing opportunities I 
detailed in a previous article, 
as well as three outdoor 
pools (two heated), 24-hour 
exercise room, tennis with 17 
courts (five lighted), jogging 
trails, miniature golf, horse-
back riding, bicycle rentals, 
golf clinics, fishing, as well 
as programs for the children 
and baby-sitting services. 

The spa is legendary 
among the  
is located in the fitness cen-
ter. I had the privilege of hav-
ing the masseuse that is as-
signed to Tiger Woods and 
his dad (Muriel Hattori) as 
my personal masseuse! Her 
gifted hands have brought 
relief to the PGA's finest 
players. One treatment and I 
understood why! And yes, if 
Tiger is not in, you may re-
quest her as your masseuse. 
Various massage types are 
available, as well as facials. 
In spring 2004, the resort has 
plans to open a 20,000 
square foot spa with full-ser-
vice hair and nail saloon, 
whirlpool area, juice bar 
with health drinks, and as 
fine a fitness room as the 
Marriott can produce! 

With 508 guest rooms, vil-
las, and suites to choose 
from, you will find one that 
meets your needs, for cer-
tain. There are 4,800 acres 
surrounding the hotel (which 
includes 350 acres of fresh-
water lakes and lagoons, live 
oaks, magnolias and palms). 
There are 508 rooms, villas, 
suites and the choice of 324 
with views of water. Conven- 
tions will find ample facili- 
ties to meet their needs with 
ballrooms, 12,500 sq. ft. ex-
hibit space, pavilions for 
weddings, and.did I mention 
this is the largest meeting 
facility at a resort between 
Atlanta and Orlando? There 
are restaurants to meet every 
need and Champs Lounge 
provides an abundance of 
nightlife to the resort. 

What makes this resort in-
viting, is not just the revolu-
tionary exciting new ways to 
cater to family needs, 
beaches, tennis, and golf- but 
it is only minutes away from 
the historic St. Augustine 
where you find yourself 
walking back into time. Next 
time I'll walk down the 
cobble stone streets of St. 
Augustine with you. 

You are only a short drive 
away from Daytona Speed-
way as well as Walt Disney 
World and all the Orlando 

Cisco Junior College's 
Dinner Theatre will be pre-
senting "Guys and Dolls" as 
the second production of its 
2003 summer season. 

Directed by Le Jones, 
"Guys and Dolls" is a 
Broadway favorite and also 
a movie, which starred 
Frank Sinatra and Marlon 
Brando. 

The story involves two 
gamblers who are to give up 
"the game" for the women 
they love. Nathan Detroit 
(Le Jones) has been en-
gaged to Miss Adelaide 
(Dorothy Dowell) for 14 
years and must relinquish his 
role as locator for the ongo-
ing dice game to marry her. 
Sky Masterson (Taylor 
McClain) pursues Sarah 
Brown (Angela Kennedy) an 
evangelist at the Save-a-soul 
Mission and is to leave gam-
bling to save his soul. 

CROSSWORD PUZZLE 
1. 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 
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ACROSS 	 DOWN 

1. Incline 	 1. Entry on a to-do list 
4. Sheepish reply 	 2. Thinker's reward 
7. Discontinue 	 3. Carson's predecessor 

11. Town southeast of Oklahoma 	4. Generate 
City 	 5. Orangutan, e.g. 

12. Maintained 	 6. What opposites do 
13. Open 	 7. One-liner 
14. Mediterranean, e.g. 	 8. Night 	Night (Reagan 
15. " 	misty..." (2 wds.) 	 film) 
16. Product 	 9. March date 
17. Type of chop 	 10. Scholarly volume 
19. Lie down 	 . 	12. Toys with tails 
21. Pernicious 	 18. Make changes 
23. Parks and Convy 	 20. Bush or Clinton 
26. Tartness 	 22. Filaments 
31. Gannon University's locale 	23. Actress Benaderet 
32. Drill insert 	 24. White-tailed bird 
33. "As 	as a painted 	25. Finagle 

ship..." (Coleridge) 	 27. Ration one's rations 
34. Hotter under the collar 	 28. Scene of the Judgment of 
36. Do a double take, perhaps 	 Paris 
37. Good-luck animal 	 29. Doter's treatment: abbr. 
39. Holds tightly 	 30. " 	Do I Marvel" (Cullen) 
43. Gave the boot 	 32. Monstrous 
47. Deceit 	 35. Puck 
48. Hence 	 36. Say "up and at 'eml" 
50. Make 	while the sun 	38. Spectacular successes 

shines 	 39. Became bigger 
51. Feminine suffix 	 40. Baseballer Babe 
52. Run easily 	 41. Italian wine city 
53. Rile 	 42. Get through the cracks 
54. Blender setting 	 44. The 	Man 
55. Of course! 	 45. Realize 
56. Opposite of SSW 	 46. Jerry Van 

49. Gardener's tool 

This puzzle sponsored by 

WO 
1•00  

• • 	i  k % 

•...:•. 	. 
P. 0. Box 877 

254-629-1737 	Eastland, TX 76448 	800-633-9190 

"Guys and Dolls" is filled 
with many recognizable 
tunes such as "Luck be a 
Lady" and "Sit Down You're 
Rockin' the Boat." Audience 
members find themselves 
humming as they leave the 
theatre. 

Performance dates are July 
17-20 and 24-27 at the 
Conrad Hilton Community 
Center. Dinner performances 
($15) are Thursday through 
Saturday at 7 p.m.; Sunday 
dessert matinees ($7.50) are 
at 2 p.m. For more informa-
tion or to make reservations, 
call (254) 442-2589. 

Recipe Corner 
English Muffin Broccoli  

Pizza 
2 sour dough English 

muffins 
1/4 cup pasta sauce 
1/4 cup broccoli florets, cut 

in fine pieces 
1/4 cup light shredded 

mozzarella cheese 
Wash hands. Split the 

English muffin in half and 
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The Texas Workforce 
Commission (TWC) an-
nounced its approval of an 
$11,134,555 allocation to 
fund workforce services pro-
vided through the West Cen-
tral Texas Workforce Devel-
opment Board (WCTWDB) 
for Fiscal Year 2004. The 
money allocated to 
WCTWDB is used to fund a 
variety of solutions, including 
services for employers to as-
sist them in finding qualified 
workers. This is accom-
plished by screening appli-
cant lists, scheduling inter- 

place them cut side up on a 
cookie sheet. Use a spoon to 
put 1 Tablespoon of pasta 
sauce on each muffin half. 
Place 1 Tablespoon of 
broccoli on each muffin half. 
Top each muffin half with 1 
Tablepoon shredded cheese. 
Bake each muffin in the oven 
at 375 degrees until cheese 
melts and the muffin is 
toasted, about 10-15 
minutes. Serve hot. 

excitement. Your stay at this 
graciously sprawling resort 
will long be remembered as 
one of life's best choices! 
Don't forget- it is America's 
golfing at four mesmerizing 
course- for those who golf! 
The beach lovers will find 
almost three miles of pristine 
sand and water awaiting 
them. 

www.marriotthotels.corn/ 
jaxsw or call 904-285-7777 
for reservations. Happy Trav-
eling! 

"To the ends of the earth 
and then some." 

E-mail 	wwtravcons 
@aol.com 
You may e-mail travel ques-

tions free of charge to me at 
wwtravcons@aol.com 
(World Wide Travel Consult-
ing). 

Read The Classifieds 

views and arranging space for 
the interviews, if necessary. In 
addition, funding is provided 
to assist job seekers in obtain-
ing skills required for jobs 
that are available in the re-
gion. Welfare and food stamp 
recipients are provided ser-
vices to help them become 
self-supporting through job-
search assistance and job-
readiness classes, basic skills 
training, and support services, 
including childcare and trans-
portation. 

The W6st Central Texas 
Workforce Development 
Board serves nineteen coun-
ties, including Brown, 
Callahan, 	Coleman, 
Comanche, Eastland, Fisher, 
Haskell, Jones, Kent, Knox, 
Mitchell, Nolan, Runnels, 
Scurry, 	Shackelford, 
Stephens, Stonewall, Taylor 
and Throckmorton counties. 

The WCTWDB is one of 
28 local workforce develop- 
ment boards throughout the 
state that, in partnership with 
TWC, delivers workforce so-
lutions through the state's 279 
Texas Workforce Centers. 
The primary goal of the state-
wide workforcesystem is to 
guarantee that a skilled and 
qualified workforce is in 
place to meet the needs of 
Texas' employers through lo-
cally controlled, employer-
driven workforce develop-
ment initiatives and pro-
grams. All employers, as well 
as workers and job seekers, 
are eligible to take advantage 
of these services, which are 
primarily federally funded 
and generally probided at no 
charge to the customer. 

;t) 

Randolph Ford 
200 E. 1-20 Cisco, Texas 

254-442-1566 1-800-749-1616 

Battery & Charging System 
Service with a two year free warranty 

Diesel extra 

Come See 

Domestic Cars & Trucks 
Oil & Filter Change 

plus complete under hood check 

$29.95 plus tax 

Diesel Oil and 
Filter Change 

plus complete under hold check 
Exc 6.0 

$49.95 plus tax 

$28.00 plus tax 



MOBILE HOMES 
FOR SALE 

1995 16 x 80 2 
Bedroom, 2 Bath, to be 
moved, $25,000. (254) 
631-1624. 

E63 

SICK OF RENTING? 
We sell clean late model 
manufactured homes for 
less per month than your 
rent (180 to 300 per month 
range) easy quality repos, 
wholesale repos. I hate for 
you to pay rent, give me a 
chance to help. Call Terry 
325-672-1490. 

E46-104 

MOBILE HOMES 
FOR RENT 

REAL ESTATE 

NEW LISTING: Sipe 
Springs, very neat and 
attractive 3-1 frame, 1200' 
LA, well and water meter, 
app 1 acre lot. Reduced 
to $30,000. 

NEW LISTING: 37 A N/ 
W of DeLeon, good sandy 
land, app. 5 A coastal, 
stock pond, 3 water wells, 
pavement access, great 
building spot. $1,250 per 
A. 

NEW: 47.65 A 4 miles 
west of Gorman, 25 A 
coastal, 20 Acult, 2 ponds, 
barn/pens, good deer 
area. $1050 acre. 

New Listing: 80 A, app 
70 A heavy oak timber, 
good deer/turkey hunting, 
CR frontage. $1,250 per 
acre. 

142 A, app 120 wooded, 
20 A field, deer/turkey 
hunting, CR frontage. 
$875 A. REDUCED TO 
$795 A. 

NEW LISTING: 175 A, 
100 A heavily timbered, 
some cultivation, CR 
frontage on 2 sides, water 
well, good deer, turkey, 
hog hunting. $1,250 per 
acre. 

NEW LISTING: 212 A, 
investment/cattle property, 
near Desdemona, all in 
coastal, 15 irrigation wells, 
fenced, pipe corral, 
pavement, large peanut 
base. $1,600.00 per acre. 

979 A W. Comanche  

Cn en• 

HELP WANTED HELP WANTED BUSINESS SERVICES IBUSINESS SERVICES 

     

 

Paul Williams Roofing Co. 
Free Estimates 

All Work Guaranteed 
All Types of Roofing 

	
r. 

SPECIALIZING IN COLORED METAL ROOFS 

25 Years Experience In Area 

Carbon, Texas 
	

254-639-2330 
1-104 
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House Leveling & 0 
Foundation Repair 

By David Lee & Co. 
Professional Work Since'1967 

* Free Estimates * 
No Payment Until Work Is Satisfactorily Completed 

• Solid Slab • Pier & Beam • Concrete Piers 
• Block & Pad • Floor Bracing 
Steel Piers To Bed Rock 

Work Guaranteed - Insurance Claims 
Licensed & Bonded 

254-965-5635 	915-675-6369 
ci 	 ,,,,, 	a 
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AUTOS 
	• 

1986 3/4 ton GMC truck, 
4 speed, $1500. 629- 
3333. 

E59 

1989 Honda Accord, 4 

door, blue, 106,000 miles 
$2,200. 629-3466, leavE 
message. 

E5 

AUTO FOR SALE 
1986 Cadillac Sedar 
DeVille, 	excellently 
maintained. 	Electric 
windows, doors and plush 
interior. Cruise control. 
Excellent sound system. 
Good tires. 117,000 miles. 
SPECIAL: $3,995.00. Call 
254-629-2413 after 6 p.m. 
only. 

E104 

CLEAN VAN FOR SALE: 
1991 GMC, low mileage 
van with total Designer 
conversion. SPECIAL: 
$5,995. Call 254-629- 
2413 after 6 p.m. only. 

E104 

SABINE ERRACE 
APARTMENTS 

Available For 

Immediate Occupancy 
'Large 1, 2 & 3 Bedrooms 

'All Utilities Paid  
'West Central Texas Govt. 

- 	*No Pets 
'Short Term Leases 
'Central Air & Heat 
Program Vouchers 

Acci_.pted 

Eastland 629-2518 
EHO 

T1 1 

MOBILE HOME FOR 
RENT: 2 BR, 2 BA, Central 
H/A, in nice park. No Pets. 
$300 + deposit. 629-1848. 

E104 

FOR RENT: No deposit 
with utilities paid. 3 or 2 
bedroom mobile home. 
Refrigerator, 	stove, 
washer, dryer, furnished. 
SUNSHINE VALLEY, 
Leona Morton, 442-1365. 

C104 

APARTMENTS 
FOR RENT 

Painting - Interior & Exterior 
Paper Hanging 
Sheetrock Repairs 

'Blown Acoustical Ceilings 
Tape & Bedding 
Light Carpentry 

Work Guaranteed • References 

Call Christopher Painting 
254-442-1480 or 1-800-938-5097, 

CEN-TEX 
TREE SERVICE 

Trees cut and removed. 
Free estimates. 325-784- 
7893. 

E62 - 
M,•••••••••MPW••••• •••M ----- mvm...•• 

B.B.Q. "As Good As There 
Is" call ahead or just stop 
in. 325-662-3328. The 
Fillin' Station, Putnam, Tx. 

E58 

Steinman Fencing • 
Building Quality 

Fences 
for Over 20 years 

'Commercial & 
Residential 

"Chainlink•Wood•Metal 
'Wrought Iron•Vinyl 

Custom Gates 
'Electric & Solar Gate 

Openers 
(254) 629-1649 

E104 

CIRCLE D FENCE 
(Insured) 

All Types of Fence 
Chainlink, Vinyl, Privacy, 

Barbwire, Pipe 
We also do Entrances, 

Gateways, 
Metal Buildings 

Reasonable Rates 
254-629-2705 

E5-104 

GARAGE, YARD, 
CARPORT SALES 

OTHERS 

SAM'S 	SAWMILL 
LUMBER SALE S. Ily 19th 
7 a.m. to 5 p.r i. Over 
7,000 board feet of yellow 
pine and red cr- Jar. 254-
559-1053 horr 3 or 254-
559-0853 cell 

E57 

WANTED/NEEDED 

Scrap Metal Wanted. 
Paying cash for all types 
of scrap metal. Mid Texas 
Recycling 1411 E. Main, 
Eastland, 254-629-8305. 

E104 

Wanted To Buy: Certain 
good quality large 1920 
era German wool tapestry 
paintings. Old World art 
figures - realistic art. 
Please call evenings 254-
629-2413. 

0E104 

I
HOMES FOR SALE I 

FOR SALE: In Ranger-
House and 2 Lots on 
Apple St. Call 629-2060 or 
629-1020. 

E58 

IMMEDIATE OPENINGS 
for 

Emergency Room RNs 

EMH offers a competitive benefit package, 
salary commensurate with experience 

Interested, qualified applicants contact 

Sue Watkins, PHR 
Human Resources 

EASTLAND MEMORIAL HOSPITAL 
304 S. Daugherty 

Eastland, TX 76448 
254-629-2601, Ext. 364 Fax 254-629-8929 

EOE 

Positions open for teacher 
assistant and classroom 
teacher and Redeemer 
Preschool. We are a 
private preschool, we 
teach a Christian based-
curriculum. Our opening 
hours are Tuesday and 
Thursday. For more 
information contact Kathy 
Conring at (254) 442- 

2701. 
C57 

------- 	-------- - 
Need experienced Body 
Man at Joel's Paint & Body 
254-629-1195. 

E63 

Help 	Wanted 	at 
Jalapeno's Mexican 
Restaurant 3800 E. 1-20, 
Eastland. 

E58 

The Crime Victim 
Assistance Center is 
currently 	accepting 
applications for an 
opening as the Outreach 
Coordinator. This will be a 

lull-time position. Qualified 
applicants should have at 
least a High School 
Diploma or GED and 
some college is preferred. 
Previous office experience 
is a must (answering a 
multi-line phone system, 
typing, filing, making 
copies, etc.) and public 
speaking experience is 
preferred. The Outreach 
coordinator will work 
primarily in the Outreach 
Office (Breckenridge) with 
one day a week in the 
Business 	Office 
(Eastland). Interested 
parties should call 254-
629-3223 for further 
information. 	Walk-in 
applications will not be 
accepted. 

E58 

C.N.A. 
Villa Haven Health & 
Rehabilitation Center has 
openings for resident 
centered, hard working 
nurses aides. We offer a 
benefits package, plus a 
positive professional work 
environment. Apply 300 
W. Jackson, Brecken-
ridge, TX. 254-559-3386. 

E52-104 

STEPHENS MEMORIAL 
HOSPITAL 

200 S. GENEVA ST. 
BRECKENRIDGE, 

TEXAS 76424 
HAS THE FOLLOWING 

POSITION OPEN: 
X-RAY TECHNICIAN 

FOR WEEKEND 
COVERAGE 

(CT experience 
preferred) 

Salary Negotiable 
If interested, qualified 

applicants may contact 
Marty Dover in Human 
Resources at 254-559- 
2242 ext. 307 or e-mail: 

marty@smhtx.com 
for application and 

additional information. 
EOE 

E57 

The Eastland County 
Commissoners' Court is 
accepting Applications 
supported by resume for 
the position of Eastland 
County Cooperative 
Dispatch Administrator. 
The position is a 
Department 	Head 
Supervisor/Administrator 
position. 
Applicants 	should 
possess skills consistent 
with management of eight 
(8) 	employees, 
scheduling, emergency 
dispatch, law enforcement 
and emergency services 
procedures, 
intergovernmental 
coordination and emergcy 
management 
coordination. 
In addition, Applicant's 
should possess general 
management skills that 
support 	record 
maintenance, payroll, 
reporting, budgeting and 
general operations of an 
emergency 	service 
organization. 
The position will pay 
$10.00 per hour with 
benefits (or $21,000.00 a 
year, plus benefits). 
Applications may be 
obtained at the Eastland 
County Auditor's office in 
the Eastland County 
Courthouse, 100 West 
Main, Ste. 205, Eastland, 
Texas. 
Applications, with resume 
are due in the Eastland 
County Judge's office on 
or before 5:00 p.m. July 
24, 2003.  
Eastland County is an 
equal 	opportunity 
employer. 

E59 

RN/LVN 
Villa Haven Health & 
Rehabilitation Center has 
opening for a resident 
centered, hard working 
nurse. We offer a benefits 
package, plus a positive 
professional 	work 
environment. Apply 300 
W. Jackson, Brecken-
ridge, TX 254-559-3386. 

E52-104 Ranger Care Center is 
now hiring Certified Aides 
and LVNs for the 2-10 
shift. If you are a 
dependable, reliable, 

caring worker, please 
apply in person at 460 W. 
Main St. in Ranger For 
more information call 
(254) 647-3111 and ask for 
Jessie or Stormie. 

R58 

Come join our winning 
team! Competitive salary, 
401K and insurance. 
Need outgoing people 
oriented for management. 
Must be able to work days, 
nights and weekends. 
Apply at TNT Video & Rent 
To Own 706 Conrad 
Hilton, Cisco. 

C104 

HELP WANTED 

$ Sales $ 
Above Average 

Income 
Opportunities 

Sales Team Leader 
• Excellent Base Salary 
• Limited Travel 
• No Weekends 
• Excellent Commission Structure 
• Sales Overrides 
• Great Work Hours 
• Travel Compensation 

Sales Representative 
• Excellent Base Salary 
• Sales Training 
• Limited Travel 
• No Weekends 
• Excellent Commission Structure 
• Great Work Hours 
• Travel Compensation 

Don't Miss A Great Opportunity 
To Work In A Positive 

Environment And Make The 
Mind Of Money You Have 

Always Wanted! 

For Information or to 
send resume: 

Contact 
Steve Haines 

West Texas Publishing 
212 W Commerce 
Eastland, Texas 
254-631-0754 

254-631-0756 Fax 

United House Calls of 
Texas is currently seeking 
Full Time RN and PRN 
LVN to provide Home 
Health 	Care 	in 
Breckenridge/Eastland 
and surrounding areas. If 
you're interested in 
growing with a company 
that has long term 
community commitment, 
Fax resume to 254-559-
9118 or apply in person at 
203 S. Geneva Ave. 
Breckenridge, Texas. 

E57 

BUSINESS SERVICES 

GLEN NICKS 
CONSTRUCTION 

Restoration & 
Remodeling, 

New Construction and 
Add-Ons, Cabinets, Painting, 

Electrical, Vinyl Siding, 
Storm Windows, Etc. 

Close Attention To Detail 
Free Estimates 

254-442-4880 

CLEARANCE SALE 

Best prices ever 

Redecorate for 
50% off 

regular price 
Mama's Fabric 

Outlet 
109 So. Lamar St. 
Eastland, 631-0089 

57 

ELDERLY 	CARE: 
Christian caregiver wants 
to care for elderly and 
handicapped. 	Have 
references. Call cell 254-
592-3694 and leave 
message or call 254-965-
4351. I will do 24-hour 
care. 

E57 

I will clean your house by 
the hour or by the job. Ask 
for Lois - if no answer 
leave a message. 631-
0889. 

E63 
---------------------------- 

Sam.- 

Help Wanted: Dishwasher, 
Cooks and Waitresses. 
Apply in person Texas 
Cattle 	Exchange 
Steakhouse, IH 20, Olden 
Exit, Eastland. 

E104 

Tired of working for half of 
minimum wage? Tired of 
having to share your tips 
with everyone else? We 
are currently looking for 
motivated, energetic, 
dependable, and smiling 
persons to fill PIT, HT, Day 

or Night positions and 
dependable breakfast 
cooks Mon.-Sun. Apply in 
person at Sonic in 
Eastland. 

E104 

fitrt171.11tajl-S011,1111d MONSTERS. NC. 

i ``Unlike aniy movie 
you've ever seen! 

DisneyiPixar have topped themselves again!" 
1401 

FINDING 	
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Fri. • Sat. • Sun. • Mon. 
All Shows: 7:30 p.m.- $4.00 

10-Adr.ission Passes - $35.00 
5-Admission Gift Pass - $20.00 

Adults Only Balcony Ticket - $5.50 

FOR RENT 

FOR RENT: Duplex 2 BR, 
1 1/:.

s 
 I k.,1 •  cirage, 

rencec yard. 4. 1. • ;65- 

E 3-104 

FOR SALE IN CISCO: 
Large house, corner lot, 3 
Bedrooms, 1 bath, utility 
room, 2 storage buildings, 
carport. (254) 629-8023. 

C61 

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
2 BR/1 Bath, large diving 
and dining room with bar, 
separating kitchen. On 2 
lg. lots, completely fenced 
with chain link fence. Easy 
walking distance to 
convenience store and 
school 	bus 	stop. 
Immediate possession. 
Call 254-629-1509. 

E57 

LAKE LEON HOUSE FOR 
SALE: Nice 2/1, C/H, 
window units, fireplace, 
deck. Two large lots, many 
trees. Water frontage, two 
sides. Guest house, 
attached carport, Dock 
and storage buildings. Call 
254-647-1662 after 6 p.m. 

E51-104 

-maelallirw ir,•;-.•.-e--; 

Cisco Press 442-2244 Eastland Telegram 629-1707 Ranger Times 629-1707 

Eastland County Classifieds 
Monday, July 14, 2003 

LIVESTOCK 

KEITH BRANGUS 
Registered & 
Commercial 

Bulls For Sale 
Fertility Tested 
254-639-2210 

IMMEDIATE OPENINGS 
for 

Registered Nurses in Acute Care Unit 
3 pm to 11 pm 
11 pm to 7 am 
7 pm to 7 am 

Eastland Memorial Hospital offers 
competitive salary & benefit package 

Interested, qualified applicants contact 

Sue Watkins, PHR 
Human Resources 

304 S. Daugherty 	Eastland, TX 76448 
254-629-2601, Ext. 364 Fax 254-629-8929 

FOE 

E57 

FOR SALE: Commercial 
Brangus Bulls. Call 254- 
E47-1155 after 6 p.m. 

R78 

MOBILE HOME FOR 
RENT: 2 BR, $350 mo. No 
deposit, utilities included, 
647-1941. 

R48-104 

GROUNDKEEPER NEEDED 
30 hrs/week. Litter pick-up and 
groundkeeping. Must have valid 
driver's license. We hire persons 
with disabilities or other barriers 

to employment. Apply at Goodwill 
in Eastland 2001 1-20. 	3-59 

USED APPLIANCES 

USED APPLIANCES 
The Almost New Shop 
305 S. Breckenridge, 

Ave. 
Breckenridge, TX 
(254) 559-2789 

E66 

Ruth Schaefer Stewart, 
M.Ed., 
L.P.C-S 

Licensed Professional 
Counseling Serviee- 	•  
Individuali 	or Grotm.  

•S.i • 	• i 

„want irontage, rural 
water, deer & turkey. 
$675.00 per acre, will 
divide, no small tracts. 

Selling Comanche, 
Eastland and Brown 
Counties since 1954 and 
we WANT to sell yours. 
We solicit and appreciate 
your listings. 

COGBURN REAL 
ESTATE 

DE LEON 
OFFICE (254) 893-6666 

1 	• 	• PETS yerli HOME 893-2642 
758-2401 

www.cogbumrealestate.com 
RS104 Border Collie Puppies For 

Sale: Out of good working 
parents, $200.00. 254- 

442-3000. 

Child and Adolescent I " 
Parenting Skills 
Women's Issues 
Geriatric Concerns 
Play Therapy 
Sand Tray 
Grief Recovery 
Divorce Recovery 
For appointments please 
call (254) 442-4280 (home 
office in Cisco). 

C60 

C57 

FOR SALE: Carbon, TX. 
Approx. 1 acre, Highway 
6 frontage, close to 
caution light. Good well, 

city water, double wide 
mobile home, 5 bedroom, 
3 full baths, total elect., 
Central Air & Heat, cover 
of metal roof, double 
carport, 14 x 70 shop, and 
small 2 Bedroom house. 
Priced to sell, 629-2984. 

E61 

FOR SALE 

CEDAR RIDGE 
APARTMENTS 

New Owners 
Clean Furnished or 

Unfurnished Apartments 
Security Guard on 

grounds 
Maintenance 
Total Electric 

Laundry 
Central Heat/Air 

Near Schools/Hospital 
No Pets 

254-629-2805 

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
Rural Land in the Carbon 
area; interested buyers, 
mail: Land Offer, P.O. Box 
5, Eastland, TX 76448 or 
call 254-629-2384 for 
information. 

E72 E104 

FOR SALE: Wedding 
Dress - hand beaded, size 
5, w/crown. Beautiful 
dress- must see. 631-
0624 after 5 p.m. 

E104 

at the Eastland Telegram, 
215 S. Seaman, Eastland. 

E104 

The Story of Old Rip is 
available at The Eastland 
Telegram in booklet form. 

E104 

BOOKS FOR SALE 

-WOW- 
EXTREME POWER 

PLUS 
ONLY $12.95 

LOSE WEIGHT 
NATURALLY, FEEL 

GREAT, HAVE LOTS OF 
ENERGY 

Available at both 
Minit Marts 

400 S. Seaman or 
926 E. Main , Eastland 

Or call 629-3806 to get a 
great discount. 

Introducing Ephedra 
Free 

E1C:. FOR SALE: 28 ft. Scout 
Travel Trailer. Older but 
good condition. Call 8-10 
p.m. 442-2298. 

C58 

Convenience Store For 
Sale or Lease. More 
information fax your name, 
address, and telephone # 
to 1-325-698-9026. 

E58 

ROYAL OAKS 
APARTMENTS 

Furnished 	and 
unfurnished 1 and 2 
bedroom; carpet and 
drapes, 	refrigerator, 
range, and disposal. 
Water, trash pickup and 
TV cable paid. Also, 
laundry room at complex. 
Choice neighborhood. 
See and compare at 1304 
Royal Lane, Cisco, or call 
442-3232, 	Resident 
manager. 

C104 

E104 

Small 	established 
ousiness on the square for 
sale. Call for appointment 
254-629-8032 9:00-5:00. 

E59 

FOR SALE 7 
FOR SALE: Blackeyed 
peas, sweet corn. You F )R SALE: Structural 

	

pick. Childress Farms 	S el, Angles, Channels, 
(254) 725-6866. 	 St .are, Round, Flat at 

	

E58 	Mid Texas Recycling 1411 
W. Main, Eastland, 254-

FOR SALE: 3 629-8305. 
Compartment Comm. 
Stainless Stl. Sink -
$200.00. 

'86 Chevy LWB Pickup 
w/ -4) .ilt 350 motor, has 

\it in trans., air cond., 
' 	ck carb., pwr. 

. and locks, 
Jminum wheels - 5 hole, 

$3,000.00 OBO. 
Custom chrome tool box-

diamond plate. Fits '86 
Chev. pickup. 

After 6 p.m. 631-0501 
E58 

A uvertise 
in the 

COUNTRY VILLA APTS 
1-2 bedrooms, kitchen 
appliances, Central H/A, 
W/D, pool. On site security 
and maintenance. (Behind 
Pizza Inn) 1099 Lago 
Vista Blvd. Eastland, 
Texas. Contact Sergio or 
Isabell 	Hernandez, 
Managers 629-2769, if no 
answer call 629-2348. 

E104 ClaSSifiedg 
ES  I IC TI-111A1 It 

629- 
GHOLSON HOTEL 

APTS 
If you are 55 years of age 
or older, handicapped or 
disable, and want a nice 
quite place to live, come 
by the Gholson or call 
Martha at 254-647-1513. 

R104 

HELP WANTED 

GIRLING HEALTHCARE 
Salaried and Contract PTs 
Fee-For-Service PTAs 
Large, growing home 
health agency is hiring 
Therapists in the Eastland 
area. Please call 1-800-
982-5817 x 5055 or fax a 
resume to Matt at (512) 
371-9096. Email a resume 
to: 	opportunities 
@girling.com. Equal 
Opportunity Employer 

E54,56,58,60 



.. allahan Ctunty (Baird) Star 

Ag Talk By Charlie Stenholm 

125 W. Walker Breckenridge 254-559-3016 
Add The Latest Fashions To Your Wardrobe 

SrackSuits Dresses 

50% OFF 
Don't Miss This! 

439t4Aikcw 5.63 

slacks 
Capris .Q..4 .1 stojw.  

-d 

Tr. 

Cas'Frce St8.790 
Rebate . 	S2 501  

AUTO 
$1 6,290 

TO,V ANTI.SPI‘: T 

4x2 	 4x4 	 4x4 

- $25,690*140*-:-$30,791* 

	

.2C1Orit
,
-Ut 	d 

5•SFEE5 r1.0. 	 ' 	•  flPEED HD' 	 • 	fAUTOIHT" '91  
Cash Pri,:a S2C.ISh 	 Cash-Pr.ice S32.990 	 Cash Price S33.2?: 
Retale 	S2.5OG 	 Ratite 	t2 5M 	 Rebate ........ S'2.5N 

$28,490* $31,990* $32,890 
5 •S?EEC 	 6•FiEr.:: D 	 AUTO HD 

Cash, Pr.. 5,3119S..: 	 Cash Pr.:2 $34,-13:.; 	 Cash Price 5.35,33.3 
Retale, 	. 52.50 	 P.i:?!..1 	52.5C1.. 	 Rebate . .52.500 

2002 Dodge Ram 150o Quads 1992 Chevy 2500 4x4 
Auto, Reg. Cab, Long Bed, 

350, #E0136413 

t Rebate or 0% • Plus Dealer Adds TT&L Not Included .1. 03 2500's, '2,500 Factory Rebate, '500 Farm Bureau, '4,000 Randoi h Discount on Select Models 

in  Eamtlaraidll 
aeon 

1310 East Main St. EXIT 343 off 1-20 West 
254-629-8986 • 14388-591-0051 

2003 DODGE RAM 1500 REG. CAB 
Va. AC T1'.1.  CROSS, Mt' EXTRAS 

5s".$15,490 
Casty ='9.e S17.9.93 
Re 	. S2 5F, 

2003 DODGE Flp!C.ILT5CR9,9 QUAD C AB 
I 0 9 UUU  - 	case Pace 	51,490  Rebate 	52.500 

LONE STAR 4X2 $229 490 
L  

Cash Prce .... 524,990 
Rebate 	. S2.500 

4-• 

TO, VB. 20' WHEELS 

gDODGE T 
SUMMER 
SALES DRIVE 

$ up to 
0/n  

WAC 7000OFFOrtoqo mos. 

2003 DODGE DAKOTA SPORT 
001,0 CAB. AUTO 1,iAGNul 

..A111111•1 

$18  490* 
Cash Price S21."-50 

9 	Rebate 	53 000 

2003 DODGE DURANGO 
5 =1.'0 PORT CD 

--4111r4V1.!C\.W4‘ 

520,490. Cash Price 	9.•3 

Rebate 	04 5C10 

2003 CHRYSLER PT CRUISER 
C 	C,(„:,SE DEEP TNT 

imi',110(1  

$14,990 CRaestha.,Pehce 01j2.45,9j00 

2003 CHRYSLER TOWN & COUNTRY lXi 

I 
D .  tAllreW  

11°  rauc°  
Or..-5 • r' 

526,590* Cria:bhaiPerice iS30, 

S3.500

090 

2003 JEEP GRAND CHEROKEE LAREDO 
2,VD. AUTO. V6, Tia CRUISE 

• 

$21,990 CRaesbahtPence...52$43.,909000 

n  o 60 Mo. 
11/ WAC 

YOUR WEST TEXAS VOLUME DEALER   
2001 Dodge 3500 
Agir-vt„iii  Quad, SLT, 

6 Speed , 
• H.O., 

#E01945A 

2000 Ford F-150 
XLT, 

Super Cab, 
#E01910B 

1998 Dodge 2500 4x4 
SLT, Quad, 

r 4  Cummins, 
#E02007A 

2001 G C 14' Cube Van 

2000 Chevy 3500 4x4 
Crew Cab, 45K 
Miles, 350 V8, 
Auto, Flatbed, 

#E01542B 

$19/490 

2002 Chevy 1500 
LS, Ext Cab, V8, Clean, 

#E01323B 

8/990 
2000 GMC 2500 Crew 

Short Bed, Auto, 350, LS, 
Clean, #E01984A 

4/990 
2003 Jeep Wrangler 

Sport, V6, 5 Speed, 2 Tops, 
#E01440A 

$20/490 

A 

-888-5971r 7 	-0051  
iimr.randolphdodge.colo 

E 

9 6/990 
Sportside, #E01285A 

5 Minute Approval 
24 Hours a Day 
1-800-262-4710 

2003 Jeep Grand Cherokee 
Laredo, V6, 
14K Miles, 
Save $$ vs. 

New! #D00180 

$21,990 

2001 Ford F-150 
Super Cab, Lariat, 4x4, 

$19/990 

90/990 

1995 Dodge 2500 4x4 
Club Cab, 5 Speed, SIT, 

Flatbed, #E02053A 

2001 Dodge 2500 
Quad, Auto, SIT, Short 

Bed, #E00506A 

$18/990 

$15/990 

1999 GMC Yukon SLT 
4 Door, Leather, Rear A/C, 

Clean, #E01098E 

1999 Dodge 3500 
SIT, Quad, Cummins, 
85K Miles, #E01919B 

Stroke, 
Auto, 

Short Bed, 
#E01875A 

$23/990 

$10/990 

2001 Chrysler PT Cruiser.  
Auto, V6, Limited, 

NE01026A 

1997 Dodge 1500.4x4 
SLT, Sport, Auto, 88K Miles, 

#E01558A 

91,990 

1997 Dodge 2500 
Quad, SLT, 5 Speed, 
Cummins, #E01491C 

$11,990 

$5,990 
$19,990 

Auto, V8, 
Loaded, 

5 
Available 

2002 Dodge 2500 Quad 
SLT, 6 Speed, Cummins, Long 

Bed, Low Miles, #E01914A 

$23/990 

2003 DODGE 2500 QUAD CAB SILT 

1 4  

2003 DODGE 3500 QUAD CAB SLT 
CUM1.1,NS. TRA.LER TOW, ANTI.SPIN T T. MIRRORS 

4x2 	 • 4x4 	 4x4 

2002 Dodge 2500 4x4 
Quad, SLT, 

Auto, 
Cummins, 
#E02047A 

2000 Dodge 2500 4x4 
Reg Cab, Cummins, ST, 

5 Speed, #E02054A 

$14/990 

2002 Dodge 1500 4x4 
Quad, V8, SLT, Auto, 
20K Miles, #E014878 

$23/990 

1997 Chevy 1500 
Ext Cab, Silverado, Auto, 

#E01410AA 

$7,990 

2000 Ford F-150 
XLT, Super Cab, Auto, V8, 

#E00847A 

$12/990 

2000 Dodge Durango 
V8, Auto, Sport, Clean, 

#E01405A 

3/990 

2001 Toyota Tacoma Crew 
V6, Auto, Pre-Runner, Lots 

of Extras, #E01505A 

$18/990 

2001 Dodge 2500 4x4 
Quad, SLT, 6 Speell H.O., 

Clean, #E01845AA 

$24/990 

2002 Dodge Durango 
SLT, 3rd Seat, V6, Low Miles 

#D00152 

$19,990 

1997 Ford Taurus 
Very Clean, V6, Auto, 
Pwr. W/L, #D00180A 

$5,990 

2000 Chevy Malibu 
Loaded, LS, Low Miles, 
One Owner #E0064713 

$8/990 

2001 Dodge 1500 4x4 
Quad, SLT, Auto, V8, 

#E01572A 

$19/990 

2001 Dodge 1500 4x4 
Quad, Auto, SLT, Must See 

#E01492A 

97,990 

2003 Dodge Lonestar 
20" Wheels, 9K Miles, V8, 

#E02086A 

$20/990 

2001 Ford Taurus 
SEL, All Options, V6, 
Low Miles, #E00570A 

$9/990 

BSE Update 
Canada continues to get 

high marks for its handling of 
the one isolated case of Bo-
vine Spongiform Encephal-
opathy (BSE), or mad cow 
disease. 

A report by an international 
panel of four animal health 
experts has praised the "com-
prehensive scope, level of 
analysis and thoroughness of 
the investigation." 

According to this panel, 
Canadian experts collected 
and assessed a level of infor-
mation that far exceeds the 
investigations done in most 
other BSE-affected countries. 

The panel noted that the 
BSE risk management mea-
sures that were already in 
place in Canada reduced the 
spread and development of 
the disease, and that the Ca-
nadians are an example of 
dedication and competence. 

The United States is still 
working diligently with the 
Canadian Government to ex-
amine when the beef export 
market borders will again 
open between the two coun-
tries. 

Distance Learning and 
Telemedicine Program 

Hearing 
Last week, the House Ag- 

riculture Committee held a 
hearing regarding the Depart-
ment.  of Agriculture's Dis-
tance Learning and 
Telemedicine Program. 

This Program provides 
grants to rural schools and 
health care providers so that.,..  
they MT invest in ttlecomniii'L, ' 
nication facilities and equip- 
ment to bring educational and 
medical resources to those in 
rural areas who otherwise 
might not be able to receive 
it. 

This is an important pro-
gram because, given the cur-
rent changes in rural America, 
health care for elderly rural 
residents is becoming more 
urgent. 

And rural West Texas is hit 
the hardest due to the high 
cost of medical care and a 
short supply of qualified 
health care professionals. 

Last week's hearing fo-
cused on how the program 
can be improved through bet-
ter access and quality. 

Disaster Assistance 
Sign-up 

According to the state FSA 
office, the necessary tools and 
preparations for disaster as-
sistance sign-up now appear 
to be in place. 

Some folks had been expe-
riencing delays, either be-
cause their local FSA office 
did not have the computer 
capability or the staff training 
to complete the sign-up. 

In fairness to the FSA of-
fices, they have had plenty to 
do in finishing up the sign-up 
for the Direct and Counter-
cyclical Program (DCP), the 
general CRP sign-up, and 
processing the acreage re-
ports that were due June 30th. 

The only problem that may 
arise is that the Risk Manage-
ment Agency (RMA) is still 
updating its crop insurance 
information, but we have 
been assured that county of-
ficials are going to let farm-
ers sign up, even if they don't 
vet have the official produc-
tion evidence from RMA. 

I know the FSA personnel  

will appreciate your patience 
and understanding as they 
work long hours to process all 
of the paperwork that these 
programs require. 

Bankruptcy Protection 
for Farmers Passes House 

Last week, the House 
passed legislation to extend 
special bankruptcy protec-
tions for an additional six 
months, therefore allowing 
family farmers the ability to 
reorganize their debt while 
still holding onto their assets. 

We anticipate that the Sen-
ate will act quickly on this 
measure and, hopefully, send 
it directly to the President for 
his signature. 

FY 2004 Agriculture 
Appropriations 

Last week, the House Ap-
propriations Committee ap-
proved an agriculture appro-
priations bill for fiscal year 

nnIn 

III It, 

2004. 
This bill would provide 

$17 billion for agriculture 
department and related pro-
grams; however this amount 
is a reduction of almost one 
billion dollars from spending 
for the current year. 

One of the most controver-
sial sections of this bill would 
prevent USDA from spending 
money to implement the 
country-of-origin labeling 
provision that was included in 
the 2002 Farm Bill. 

At a hearing this past week, 
a number of us on the Agri-
culture 

Committee continued to  

express serious concerns 
about potential problems with 
the mandatory country-of-
origin labeling that is sched-
uled to go into effect in the 
fall of 2004. 

It is not clear how the Sen-
ate will proceed with this 
matter, but I understand there 
is talk about a legislative pro-
posal that would allow live-
stock producers to self-certify 
their animals' country-of-ori-
gin. 

USDA officials have said 
that the new requirements 
will not have a positive effect 
overall and that the unin-
tended consequences on pro- 
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ducers and the distribution 

	
The packers themselves 

chain could be significant. 	seemed to agree that they 
Ag Subcommittee Holds wanted to preserve their abil- 

Hearing on Packer Ban 
	

ity to contract for specific 
The House Agriculture quality traits, which is some-

Subcommittee on Livestock thing they believe is essential 
and Horticulture recently held 

	
in terms of their ability to 

a field hearing in Grand Is-  compete in the marketplace. 
land, Nebraska, to review 	The 2002 Farm Bill en- 
proposals to ban the owner-  couraged Congress to hold 
ship of livestock by packers. 	hearings on this issue, and the 

There were about 80 pro-  recent field hearing in Ne-
ducers present, and these pro-  braska is a first step in deter-
ducers expressed mixed feel-  mining what action, if any, is 
ings about the wisdom of a needed here. 
packer ownership ban. 

Recipe Corner 
Yummy Trail Snack Mix 

	measure ingredients into 
1 cup bite size shredded 

	mixing bowl. They can use a 
vvheat 
	 spoon to mix it up. Kids 

1 cup bite size pretzels 
	should measure portions of 

1 cup raisins 
	

Trail Mix into 12 baggies, 
1 cup dried diced fruit 
	using half cup of mix for 

1 cup sunflower seeds 
	each one. Store at room 

1 cup chocolate chips 
	temperature until ready to 

Wash hands. Kids need to serve. 

Remember To Renew Subscription 



RAYNOR GARAGE DOORS 
Total System Warranty 

VETERANS GARAGE DOOR CO. 
Garage Doors • Openers • Residential & Commercial 

We Accept VISA & Mastercard 

1257 Ben Richey Dr. 
Abilene, TX 
Bus. (915) 793-9507 5.104 

Paul Jennings, Owner 
Sales - Service - Installation 

and 
Abundant Life of Gorman 

would like to invite you to 

Celebrate Jesus Aso lsillfre 

lta'r Pa 
Thm 

Lifelmpact Ministries 
3901 1-20 West on the South Access Road — Eastland 
**Service Schedule: 

Sunday School - 9:30am Classes for all ages 
Worship 	10:30am 

** Wednesday 	7:15pm "Acts in Action" 

Abundant Life 
Corner of Hwy 6 and Briscoe 
Gorman, 7X 76454 
**Service Schedule: Sunday Worship 2:00ptn 

Mee,  

Lifelmpact Ministries of Eastland 

Lifelmpact — 254.629.3806 	Abundant Life — 254.734.3631 

Call 254-629-1935 

env  lex 
ELECTRIC 

Commercial • Resident 

Licensed Master Electrician.  
License # E1072R 

s,  

Eastland, TX 

/ 254-629-1935 
After Hours Pacer :1254-629-9091. 

4,4  

iLd the 

oy‘,  

Bonus Offer! 

Free Vehicle Power 

Charger 
with new 2-year service 

agreement on rate plans 

545 and higher. 
Offer eapires July 31.2003 

CD.Nationwide  Callin 

oast to Coast! 

No -Roaming and:  
No Long Distance charges 
on select plans starting at $35 and higher 

R,,u„„ a Muhi.titqtkakijimadsat. 

New National Calling Plans from Cingular 
Wireless with no roaming or long distance 

charges! 

200 Arvtime Minutes For ;`,1',f.- 

4i. 0 Rollove 	s & 1000 Night &Weekend 
Minutesfor S45 ' 

500 Rollover Minutes & 5000 Night & Weekend 
Minutes For $55 

Eastland". 
254-629-1411 

973 East Main Street 
1-20 & State Highway 112 

Next door to Playoff Sports 

Authorized Agent of 

cinguWI nlasr 

Nokia 6340i 
Multi-Network 

GAIT Phone 

FREE 
with 2-yr 

service agreement 

Cingular also Imposes the loilensing charges:• Regulatory Cost Recovery Fee ot up to S I IS to help Mr., Its costs incurred in complying with olgigacions and 

charges imposed by State and Federal telecom regulation, a gross receipts surcharge, and State and Federal UnrearnalSolvkla charges.The Regulatory Cost 

tecovery Fee Is not a tax or govenunent required chew. Limited time offer requires + 7 year ferrite agreement and S36 activation lee.Mulil-Netwark GAIT phase 

requored. Other conditions and restrktlons apply See contract and rate plan brochure for (Mugs Requires credit approval Cannot be combined with other service 
nornotions.Mnime and other measured usage are rounded up to the nest full minute at the end of each call for bitInq purposes. Unusedminutes are forfeited on 

stens that do not Include roliover.1150 eady temunauon fee applies Night hours are Opm to lam Monday to Friday,and simeitend hours are 9pm on friday to 7am 

on Monday. Rollover and Night 6 Weekend package minutes available 011 piens SeS and highereAvst be a customer lee '0 ci•mreculha doll Rollover minute,  

expire: (5) alter twelve months (1) 'mimed lately upon default or n c uslorner changes rate plans to a eMei-eollostee plan-Rolled mar minutes are not redeemable tor 
cash or credit and aro not transferable. Minutes do not mil over unto after the Illect month's billing. Night &Weigand (nitwits do not rollovec.Ctsgular Maltese is a 

registered trademark. t he graphic kon are Seryke Marts of Cesgular Wireless 1&L 1003 Cingular Wireless llC. 
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Texas Private Landowners 
Receive Conservation Grants 

Cross Cut Reunion 
Is Set For Sunday 

Agricultyre Commis-
sioner Susan •Combs an-
nounced that Skven federal 
giants totaling'•more than 
$850,000 were awarded to 
individuals or groupt for 
conservation projects on pri-
vate lands for threatened, en-
dangered or at-risk species: 
The grants were the first 
awarded in the state under 
the new Private Stewardship 
Grants Program. 

"Private lailowners are 
fitst and fdremost stewards 
of Texas lands," Combs said. 
"With more than 97 percent 
of the state privately owned, 
landowners are important 
partners in resource and spe-
cies conservation. 

"The,Pri v ate Stewardship 
Grants Program is a tremen: 
dous partnership withthe. 

federal government that will 
continue to conserve the 
beauty and diversity of Texas 
for years to come," Combs 
said. 

The Private:_Stewardship 
Grants Program adminis- 
tered by the U.S.Department 
of the Interior's Fish and 
Wildlife Service, provides 
federal grants to individuals 
and groups engaged in vol-
untary conservation efforts  

on private lands that benefit 
endangered, threatened or at-
risk species. Each grant must 
be matched by at least 10 per-
cent of the total Cost in either 
non-federal dollars or in-kind 
contributions. 

"By working coopera-
tively with private landown-
ers, we create a framework in.  
which public and private 
partnerships serve to reward, 
not punish, landowners who 
restore habitant •and take 
other steps to prchect and re-
cover endangered, threatened 
or at-risk species on their 
land," said Deputy Assistant 
Secretary of the Interior 
David P. Smith. • 

"Obviously, the key to 
conservation of natural re-
sources in Texas is working 
in close partnership with pri-
vate landowners, so the Pri-
vate Stewardship Grants Pro-
gram is a great tool for form-
ing partnerships and preserv-
ing habitants," said Dale Hail, 
director of the U.S.Fish and 
Wildlife's Southwest Region. 

Among the Grants 
awarded was $91,875 to the 
Texas Prairie Rivers Region 
Inc.in the Northeastern Texas 
Panhandle.This will assist 
landowners who wish to re- 

store 20,786 acres of habi-
tant for at-risk species and 
other grassland species. 

Another grant of $36,000 
went to Cook.s Branch Con- 
servancy in Montgomery 
County.This grant will cre-
ate 12 red-cockaded wood-
pecker cluster recruitment 
sites. 

A grant of $4,345 went to 
Pines and Prairie Land Trust 
in Bastrop County. This will 
construct a small, shallow 
breeding pond for the Hous-
ton Toad. 

Also in Bastrop County, 
$300,000 was granted to the 
Coastal Prairies Coalition of 
the Grazing Lands Conser-
vation Initiative. The project 
will involve the reclamation, 
restoration and conservation 
of native coastal prairie in 
Texas, including grasses , 
native wildflowers, various 
birds, and the Texas Horned 
Lizard (Horned Frog). 

A grant of $100,000 is go-
ing to the Texas Wildlife As-
soc iation Foundation in 
Bell, Coryell, Hamilton and 
Kerr Counties.This project 
will implement black-
capped .vireo habitant resto-
ration along with the Leon 
River Restoration and the 
Guadalupe River Restora-
tion Projects. 

A grant of $100,000 was 
also made to the Peregrene 
Fund, Northern Aplomado 
Falcon in Andrews, 
Brewster, Cochran, Crane, 
Crockett, 	Culberson, 
Dawson, Dimrnitt, Duval, 

411116fiallw, El  

Frio, Gaines, Hudspeth, Jeff 
Davis, and a number of other 
Southwestern Texas counties. 

This project is the continu-
ation of a program to reestabl 
lish wild populations of this 
endangered species in the 
Southwestern United States 
and Northern Mexico. 

A grant of $220,841 went 
to the Wild Turkey Center, 
Riparian Habitat Improve-
ment in Briscoe, Donley, 
Hemphill and Lipscomb 
counties.This is a cooperative 
project among private land-
owners in Texas, New 
Mexico and Oklahoma who 
own land along the Canadian 
River and its tributaries to 
improve the environment. 
Some 6,000 acres are targeted 
for. this effort. Native trees 
and grasses will be re-planted 
and endangered species of 
prairie chicken and other 
wildlife will be protected. 

It sounds like these grants 
will be a real help to landown- 
ers and groups who are try-
ing to protect the environment 
and save Texas vegetation 
and wildlife. 

We note that nothing has 
been granted in the Eastland 
and Callahan County area, 
but this may change in the 
future. 
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The annual Cross Cut Re- , 
union will be held Sunday, 
July 20th, 2003, at the CidiS. • 

Plains Conimunity Center. All 
alumni, friends and family are 
invited to attend this event, as 
we enjoy a covered dish lun-
cheon and silent auction fol-
lowed by the annual business 
meeting of the Cross Cut 

Austin - Representative 
Harvey Hilderbran, R-
Kerrville, was appointed to 
serve on the Select Commit-
tee on Public School Finance. 
The committee is studying the 
state's tax structure and its 
public school finance system 
with a goal of completely re-
vamping the state's tax code 
and its method of funding 
schools. 	 . 

The process will likely: 
abolish "Robin Hood", the 
existing method of funding 
schools, which could be 
found unconstitutional after 
the Supreme Court has deter-
mined that several school dis-
tricts that have sued the state 
over the plan may pursue their 
lawsuits. 

Representative Hilderbran , 
will serve on the Employee 
Benefits/Compensation Sub-.  
committee. The subcommit7  
tee will examine and make  

Cemetery Association. 
Lunch is at noon but the 

dOors will be open at 9:00 
a.m. for those wanting to drop 
off their covered dishes and/ 
or items for the silent auction. 
Please call Chris or Jerry 
Biggecstaff at (254) 725-4189 
fcir more information or to be 
placed on the mailing list. , 

recommendations pertaining 
to, the state's role in provid-
ing compensation to school 
district employees, including 
health insurance and salary 
schedules. 

"I am- very pleased that 
Speaker Craddick chose to 
put me on his committee. In-
surance and compensation for 
school district employees are 
issues that weigh heavily on 
,the rninds of Many of my con-
'stituents," Hilderbran said. 
"Any change to the system 
must be evaluated on how it 
affects our teachers and 
school district employees." 

Representative Hilderbran 
• serves District 53 in the Texas 

Ho'use of Representatives 
Which includes Callahan, 
Coleman, Concho, Crockett, . 	. 	• 
Llano, Keer, Kimble, Mason, 
McCullock, Menard, Real, 

• Runnels, San Saba and Sutton 
counties. 

Rep. Hilderbran Named TO 
School Finance Committee 

48;..
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Two Sioux arriors at Memorial Dedication 

RISING STAR AUCTION COMPANY 
Dorothy Dunn Estate Auction 

Sunday July 20th 1:00 
All items to be sold at absolute auction with no minimums or reserves. 

No Buyers premiums No Registration fees - No hidden charges 
Dorothy Dunn was a lifelong resident of Rising Star. We have moved the 

contents of this estate into our auction house and will conduct the sale here. 
Located in downtown Rising Star just three hours or less from anywhere 

that it matters - 20 minutes south of Cisco off Interstate 20. 
Email us at rsac@eastland.net for a link to a photo album On this auction. A 
partial listing of the items in this auction includes the following: Some very 
nice antique and vintage American furniture including: small antique oak, 
ice box; antique punched tin pie safe; large 1930's burled walnut China cabi-
net and matching sideboard; reupholstered 1940's French providential sofa 
and side chair; antique oak spindle backrocker; reupholstered tufted chairs; 
marble top Eastlake lamp table; oak claw & ball, foot piano stool; antique oak 
washstand;'wieker back sofa with matching chair & rocker; set of 4 antique 
oak spindle back chairs; (6) oak ice cream chairs, sofa table and more. Con-

temporary furniture: Drexel dining table with 6 matching chairs, Thomasville 
including sideboard, pair of end tables, entryway cabinet with matching hall 
mirror; Hcnredon bar; pair of 6 ft. bookcases; marble top fern stands and 
much more. Vintage collectibles: cast iron church bell from Pioneer, TX; 
antique 10 gal, cylindrical glass gas puny tank; 250# anvil; cast iron 8 ft. 
yard light; small double sided Pennzoil "'Sound Your Z" sign; (1 I pcs.) Fi-
esta dinnerware American Fostoria water glasses, sherberts and celery bowl; 
Iris & Herringbone pitcher: large ruby red bowl; 1973 limited edition framed 
print commemorating 150th Anniversary of Texas Rangers, "One Riot - One 
Ranger"; pair of small font oil lamps: (3) cast iron wash pots; several origi-
nally framed prints inc. "Country Cottage" & "Nature's bounty"; Ingram 
kitchen clock with alarm (needs repair); 12 gal. crock jar; oakincubator; early 
brass cash register; stained glass panels; cast iron apple peeler; Roseville ure 
(minor damage); man's derby hat; Goebel bird figurine; costume jewelry; (53 
pcs.) Blue willow china; (40 pcs) 8 place setting of Havi land Bavarian china 
and much more. Major appliances and housewares: Kenmore 80 Series 
heavy duty super capacity plus washer and dryer; Whirlpool large capacity 
heavy duty electric dryer and washer several TVs (all working, one has never 
been plugged in); kitchen Roods and more. Lawn and yard equipment: 
Craftsman 19 hp 42" cut 6 speed lawn tractor; Craftsman 14 hp 42" cut 6 
speed lawn tractor; Pro brand Commercial grade, self propelled lawn mower; 
DR Trimmer Jacobson Power.Flo 2l self propelled lawn mower (suitable for 
putting greens); Echo and Craftsman 18" chainsaws; weed eaters; hedge trim-
mers; yard blower and much more. Large selection of good quality wrought 
iron patio furniture: tables; chairs and occasional furniture, Shop tools: 
Lincoln 225 amp arc welder; custom made welder's trailer; Speedaire com- 
pressor, Wells metal band saw; Wards 18" radial arm saw; Rockwell table 
saw; ToolKraft belt/disk sander, I ton Budgit electric hoist, I ton chain fall; 
appx. I doz. Victor torches, several. Victor gauge and regulator sets; floorjacks; 
Ridgid pipe tools inc. vise table, wrenches to 36" and dies to 2 1/2 pneumatic 
impact wrench: boomers; Skilsaws, hand tools of all sort including lots of 
Proto and much more. 
Auctioneer's notes: We have hauled about half of the estate and are sure to 
discover many more interesting items as the balance is hauled and sorted, 
Watch our photo album update beginning July 16th for additional photos of 
our daily progress. It is our pleasure to offer this estate at absolute auction 
with no minimums or reserves. 
110 W. College 
Rising Star, TX 76471 
254-643-4600 / 7321 

rsac@eastland.net  
Member Texas Auctioneer's Association 

Concessions available inside 
VISA Mastercard, American Express, Discover and Atm Cards welcomeB9  

Auctioneer 
Danny Koonce 

TXS 10874 

Check Out 
These Web Sites: 

The National Women's 
Health Center at www. 
healthywomen.org. 
American College of Phys-
icians at www.doctorsfor 
adults.com. 
For more information on 
the health benefits of eat-
ing apples and apple recipes, 
log onto www.motts.com. 
Crest at www.crest.com. 
"Keeping Your Kids Drug-
Free: A How-'h Guide for 
Parents and Caregivers" 
at www.theantidrug.com. 
AVAGE".  at www.avage. 
corn. 
The American College of 
Foot and Ankle Surgeons 
at www.acfas.org. 
California Dried Figs at 
www.valleyfig.com. 
Newman's Own at www. 
newmansown.com. 
McDonald's restaurants at 
www.mcdOnalds.car 
U.S. Postal Service at 
www.usps.com/shop. 
Educational sling Service 
at www.ets.org. 
'lb find out more about fam-
ily-friendly auto accessories, 
visit enjoythedrive.com. 
Microsoft's Encarta Re-
ference Library at www. 
microsoft.com/encarta. 
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"Abilene Regional 
Knows Hearts!" 

I couldn't have asked for better care than I received at Abilene 
Regional during heart bypass surgery. 	

— Archie Scarbrough 
Prison Chaplain 

Think Abilene Regional Medical Center for heart care. The 
hospital's Heart Team performed the area's first heart 
catheterization and first open heart surgery in the region. Our 
outcomes for coronary bypass surgery have consistently been 
better than those experienced statewide or across the nation. 
You'll be glad you came to Abilene Regional! 

4111 ABILENE REGIONAL 
Heart &Vascular Institute 

6250 Hwy 83/84 • AblleneM 79606 • 325-695-9900 • viremarrnc.info 
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Traveling With Purpose 
By: Walter Williams 
Americans have always 

been a mobile people. This 
is especially observable with 
the Okies and Arkies of the 
1930's. They filled a vacuum 
created by mass production of 
the automobile and the desire 
of Americans to investigate 
beyond the horizon. For a 
fact, these 20Th century 
migrants had a survival 
motivation in striking out for 
the West, but they also 
observed the beauty of the 
land and lived in harmony 
with it. Living in their tents 
and homemade trailers, they 
became the first vacationers 
with purpose. Today, due to 
the pressures of structured 
work schedules, school 
grades for the kids, and 
personal, interests, the trend is 
to multi-task even on 
vacation. Travelers are not 
content to simply relax while 
on vacation, but to enjoy the 
beauty of America while 
pursuing hobbies and 
teaching their children 
through observation and 
touch. 

Montana, especially Custer 
Country in the southeastern 
section of the state, offers a 
myriad of vacation and 
historical opportunities that 
fit the modern agenda. Over 
20 years ago, the author had 
the opportunity to visit the 
Little Bighorn Battlefield. 
The white marble markers 
and the granite Obelisk on 
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Wit's End 
Another delightful place to 

take a break from the mid-day 
heat and enjoy a sandwich, 
soup, salad or dessert is the 
Wit s End located at 400 Pine 
Street. 

Orginally a shop for 
antiques 	and 	other 
collectables and gift items, 
now lunch is also served there 
from 11:00 to 2:00, Monday 
through Saturday. "W e are 
adding lunch on Sundays," 
owner Anita Mays said. The 
featured meal sounded so 
delicious that I felt it would 
be worth a drive for that 
alone. 

Inside and outside, Wit's 
End is a charming place to 
look at and browse in - not to 
mentioned the perfect place to 
enjoy a piece of freshly baked 
buttermilk pie! 

Anita tells me that they 
also have children's tea 
parties. The girls dress up as 
real ladies in lacy , silky, 
feathery creations. It sounds 
like the perfect idea for girl's 
birthday celebrations! 

Last Stand Hill were 
impressive. 	However, 
additional research was 
necessary to understand what 
happened on that hot June day 
in 1876 when General Custer 
and 245 seventh Cavalry 
soldiers lost their lives at the 
hands of the Sioux, 
Cheyenne, and Arapaho 
warriors camped at Greasy 
Grass on the banks of the 
Little Big Horn River. Today, 
with a museum and bookstore 
on the site, as well as auditory 

Help Wanted 
The Eastland County 
Commissoners' Court is 
accepting 	Applications 
supported • by resume for the 
position of Eastland County 
Cooperative 	Dispatch 
Administrator. 
The position is a -Department 
Head Supervisor/Administrator 
position. 
Applicants should possess skills 
consistent with management of 
eight 	(8) 	employees, 
scheduling, 	emergency 
dispatch, law enforcement and 
emergency 	services 
procedures, intergovernmental 
coordination and emergcy 
management coordination. 
In addition, Applicant's should 
possess general management 
skills that support record 
maintenance, payroll, reporting, 
budgeting and general 
operations of an emergency 
service organization. 
The position will pay $10.00 per 
hour with benefits (or 
$21,000.00 a year, plus 
benefits). 
Applications may be obtained at 
the Eastland County Auditor's 
office in the Eastland County 
Courthouse, 100 West Main, 
Ste. 205, Eastland, Texas. 
Applications, with resume are 
due in the Eastland County 
Judge's office on or before 5:00 
p.m. July 24, 2003. 
Eastland County is an equal 
opportunity employer. 
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For Sale 
CLEAN VAN FOR SALE: 1991 
GMC, low mileage van with to-
tal Designer conversion. SPE-
CIAL: $5995. Call 254-629-
2413 after 6 p.m. 

B52 

Auto For Sale: 1986 Cadillac 
Sedan Deville, excellently 
maintained. Electric windows 
doors and plush interior. Cruise 
control. Excellent sound sys-
tem. Good tires. 117,000 miles, 
SPECIAL: $3995.00. Call 254-
629-2413 after 6 p.m. 

B52 

about the museum and battle 
site. Crow Park Rangers will 
join the traveler in your 
vehicle and take you 
throughout the battlefield. 
They will give you the Indian 
perspective of the battle. 
There is an additional charge 
of about $30 per hour - money 
well spent for the historical 
buff. 

In 1988 Russell Means, 
founder of the American 
Indian Movement (AIM), led 
a protest over the lack of an 
Indian memorial at the site of 
the battle. The result is a 2.3 
million dollar monument 
honoring the Indian warriors 
and scouts at the battle. 
Located just below the 7"1  
Cavalry monument, the 
Native American Monument 
is open to the four corners of 
the earth with the Northern 

view featuring three horses 
and riders silhouetted against 
the sky. A weeping wall and 
pool is located in the southern 
entrance. 

While in Custer Country, 
visit the Culture of the 
Apsaalooke or Crow Nation. 
Chief Plenty Coups State 
Park near Pryor is a great spot 
for an afternoon grill or 
picnic. Cloaked by the Wolf 
Mountains and with the 
Bozeman trail nearby, the 

Monday, July 14, 2003 

park museum deals 
exclusively with the Crow 
nation. Chief Plenty Coup 
had a vision that inspired him 
to work with the "white eyes" 
instead of fighting them. This 
explains why the Crows were 
one of the very few Indian 
Nations not relocated to other 
areas. Ask for Michael 
Hunsaker as a guide at the 
park. He will explain how the 
Crows used native Montana 
plants as well as the unique 
History of the park. Crow 
belief maintains that they are 
born into a Garden of Eden 
and live there until they leave 
the Big Horn and Wolf 
Mountains. It is only when 
they leave their native 
homeland that they have 
problems. 

The Cheyenne call the 
Little 	Big 	Horn 
battle,""where Long Hair was 

wiped away". General Custer 
smoked the peace pipe with 
the Cheyenne people and 
when leaving, he spilled part 
of the ashes on his boot and 
-the ground. When he brushed 
the sacred ashes off of his foot 
and wiped them into the 
ground, it was seen as a bad 
omen. According to 
Cheyenne history, he was not 
scalped because he had 
smoked the peace pipe with 
them. His ears were pierced 
with hair pins so that he 
would remember his words 
better in the next life. 

Chief Dull Knife College 
in Lame Deer displays a 
tremendous collection of 
Cheyenne Art and is open for 
visitors. Ask about the work 
of Leroy Whiteman and Chris 
Rowland, two local Northern 
Cheyenne artists. Indian 14rt 

is not always easily 
understood, but usually has a 
symbolic interpretation. 
According to Bentley Spang, 
a student at Dull Knife, "if 
you bought the art at a gallery 
and paid a lot of money and 
don't know what it is, it is 
probably Indian art because 
you have the rest of your life 
to figure it out." 

Custer Country offers an 
abundance of lakes and rivers 
with fishing and boating 
activities as well as horseback 
riding in the Outdoors. 
Billings has several museums 
but the Western Heritage 
Center is the premier 
attraction. Across the street 
from the museum is an Indian 
Art shop that specializes in 
Plains Indian clothing and 
decorations. Pompeys Pillar 
is just outside of Billings and 
is a tremendous site where 
Captain William Clark carved 
his name in a limestone face 
of the pillar. It is located 
beside the quite Yellowstone 
River on 1-94, Exit 23. Plan 
to take a picnic lunch. Even 
during the heat of the day, the 
giant cottonwoods will 

shelter the visitor from the 
sun. The view from the top 
of the Pillar is breathtaking 
and a perfect spot to phone 
back home and let everyone 
know how you're doing. 

markers and maps, the events 
and fateful decisions of 
Custer and Reno are much 
easier to follow and 
understand. In addition, the 
GarryOwen, located at the 
Greasy Grass campsite offers 
a tremendous collection of 
Battle site and Plains Indian 
artifacts. At least one curator 
is on duty to answer questions 

B.B.Q. "As Good As There Is" 
call ahead or just stop in. 325-
662-3328. The Fillin' Station, 
Putnam, Tx. 
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. 	' 
Convenience Store For Sale or 
Lease. More information fax 
your name, address, and tele-
phone # to 1-325-698-9026. 
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Renew Your 
Subscription 
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