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Law Gets Marijuana 
Plants, Drug Items

Six law enforcement offici­
als from Fisher County went 
to a residence at 205 East 
Burnside in Rotan and 
arrested two individuals for 
possession of marijuana.

At 6:20 p.m. Friday, 
January 7, officers Chuck 
Renfro, Darrell Dyer, Tom 
Jones, Randy Kin^, Mickey 
Counts, and Allan Arnwine, 
with benefit of a search 
warrant, arrested Randy 
Helms and Alex Caspar at 
the Burnside residence.

Officers indicated that 
they confiscated 7 growing 
plants believed to be mari­
juana; 1 bottle of marijuana 
seed, 1 baggie of unknown 
substance, 1 baggie of 
marijuana and seed, 4 
marijuana clips, 2 packages 

’ of Top cigarette rolling 
y  papers and 1 small leather

Dan Burk Signs 
To Play For 
larleton Texans

Joe Dan Burk, former 
all-district linebacker from 
Rotan. has become the first 
f(K)tball player of the new 
year to sign a letter of intent 
with the Tarleton State 
University Texans, TSU head 
coach Buddy Fornes has 
announced.

Burk attended West Texas 
State University the first 
semester of the current 
school year, and will transfer 
to Tarleton this spring.

The 5-10. 175 freshman 
was unanimous all-district at 
Rotan in 1975. He is the son 
ot Mr. and Mrs. Joe D. Burk, 
Rotan. His father is a former 
football coach at McMurry 
Collet

bag containing a roach clip 
and an unknown instrument.

Randy Helms was filed on 
for possession of marijuana, 
fleeing from a police officer 
and destroying evidence. 
According to Rotan Chief, 
Chuck Renfro, while Helms 
was being handcuffed he 
grabbed a handfull of 
growing marijuana plants 
and attempted to eat them.

Alex Caspar was filed on 
for possession of marijuana 
and preventing a search.
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For Aerial Applicators

COMMISSIONERS SET 
NEW AIRPORT RUIES

New Western Gift Store 
Stamp Redemption Opens

DAN BURK
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Rotan’s newest business 
will hold “ Open House” this 
weekend at 220 West Snyder 
Street.

It is the Western Gift Store 
that will be managed by- 
Vivian Helms.

To celebrate the opening 
the Western Gift Store will 
give $20.00 worth of extra 
Western Blue Stamps for 
just visiting the new location. 
A coupon for the stamps is 
available in this week’s 
paper.

Glen’s Thriftway and Fairy- 
Drug are the first two Rotan 
merchants to offer the new 
Western Blue Stamps that 
are redeemable at the 
Western Gift Store.

Both Thriftway and Fairy- 
are offering double stamps 
from January 13 through 
January 19th with Fairy- 
Drug offering an extra 
$20.00 in stamps with a $5.00 
purchase through January- 
19.

The Rotan location is the 
16th Western Gift Store

opened since April 1, 1976. 
An additional 10 stores are 
on the drawing board to be 
opened in 1977, according to 
Douglass Jones, Assistant 
General Manager of Canyon, 
Texas.

The store will be promot­
ing a new concept in the 
stamp program by permit­
ting customers to purchase 
items with stamps, stamps 
and cash, all cash, or by­
charging with either Bank 
Americard or M aster 
Charge.

“ The people of the Fisher 
County area have been most 
encouraging and extremely- 
excited about the opening of 
the new Western Gift

Store” , said Vivian Helms. 
“ We want to invite everyone 
to our open house this 
weekend” , she concluded.

Fisher County Commis­
sioners met last Monday 
morning and among other 
things set some strict rules 
and regulations for aerial 
applicators using the new 
Fisher County Airport.

Commissioners set an 
annual rental of $360.00 for 
applicators and are requiring 
them to construct a building 
to house all planes within 6 
months from signing the 
lease agreement. The appli­
cators will have to put up a 
performance bond in the 
amount of $15,000.00 to 
assure Commissioners that 
they intend to construct the 
building. Applicators will 
also be required to build a 
refuse and chemical disposal 
pit and meet all Federal and 
Texas aeronautical regula­
tions concerning the opera­
tion of their business.

The applicators will have 
to pave a strip from their

proposed hangar to the main 
taxi area, they will not be 
permitted to begin opera­
tions at the airport until the 
building is constructed and 
talk of having the applicators 
pay two years rent was 
discussed.

In other action the Com­
missioners voted to purchase 
an Autoclave sterilization 
machine for the Fisher

MICKEY COUNTS

McCaulley Board Denied 
Injunction By Judge
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The newest twist in the 
struggle for McCaulley to 
retain its school was aired 
last week when the McCaulley 
School Board brought a law 
suit against Fisher County- 
Judge Dwight Lovett, seek­
ing a temporary injunction 
that asked that the election 
not be held.

The McCaulley School 
Board in their request to 
District Judge Weldon Kirk 
for the injunction pointed out 
that it should have been the 
Commissioners Court that 
called the election and not 
Judge Dwight Lovett, and 
claimed that some of those 
signing the petition to call

the election did not actually 
affix their signautres to the 

.petition. The names were 
allegedly signed by another 
member of the family.

District Judge Weldon 
Kirk, in a telephone call to 
this newspaper early Tues­
day morning of this week, 
ruled against the request by 
the McCaulley School Board. 
“ 1 am entering an order 
denying the application for 
injunction” , said Weldon 
Kirk.

The election is scheduled 
to go off as planned on 
Saturday, January 15. There 
is a possibility that the 
lawyers for the McCaulley

School Board, G. Bert 
Smith and Robert E. Barber 
of Andrews, will request a 
higher court ruling that could 
either cancel or postpone the 
scheduled consolidation 
vote.

County Rest Home at an 
approximate cost of $1,000.

Commissioners were read 
a letter from a County- 
resident desiring financial 
help in paying for her 
monthly telephone bill. No 
action was taken on the 
request.

Dick Melton, representing 
the Roby Cemetery Associa­
tion, and Jimmy Price, 
representing that same 
group, appeared before 
Commissioners requesting 
that they give consideration 
to paving a circular area 
through the Roby Cemetery. 
Commissioners were very- 
receptive. but asked that the 
City of Roby give like 
consideration to helping with 
the cost of paving.

Minutes of the December 
meeting were read. This has 
not been customary with 
commissioners m eetings. 
The court is making it a 
pn-actice to get minutes of the 
previous meeting read and 
approved.

One item that was brought 
out in the reading of the 
December minutes was the 
approval by Commissioners 
last month to grant all Fisher 
County employees a 7 
percent cost of living raise 
effective January 1. 1977.

Commissioners also met 
with Max Lovett, representa­
tive of the architectural firm 
Lovett, Sellars, MeSpedden

and Gober of San Angelo, 
to discuss the date to accept 
bids on the remodeling of the 
buildings that will be known 
as the Fisher County Court­
house Annex. The building 
to be remodeled is the old 
Kash Food Building on the 
northwest corner of the 
Courthouse Square.

Plans are to ask contract­
ors to submit sealed bids 
before February 8th, with 
the contract to be awarded at 
the regular Commissioners 
Court meeting on February- 
14. 1977.

Continued To Page 2

Roby Commission Looks 
Into New Street Signs

The members of the Roby- 
City Commission met for 
their regular monthly meet­
ing last Monday afternoon 
and among other items 
began work on securing 
street markers for city

Jamie Walker Shows The 
Top County Market Hog

LANCE EUGENE HUDNALL WAS THE FIRST BABY BORN IN HSHER 
COUNTY FOR 1977. THE FIVE LB. ELEVEN OUNCE BOY BORN. 
JANUARY 5, IS THE SON OF SUZANNE AND DAVID HUDNALL. HE 
IS THE GRANDSON OF MR. AND MRS. EUGENE HUDNALL OF 
ROTAN AND MR. AND MRS. J.B. GOTTEN OF LUBBOCK.

The Fisher County Jr. 
Livestock Show held Satur­
day, January 8, at the Fair 
Grounds in Roby was a big 
success, according to Rich­
ard Spencer, county exten­
sion agent.

A total of 104 market hogs, 
49 market lambs, 12 beef 
heifers, and 52 market steers 
was shown. The judge for the 
show was Richard Smith, 
Hermleigh Vo-Ag teacher.

The grand champion mar­
ket hog was shown by Jamie

Henry Soliz 
Gets Degree
At Angelo StateVHenry Soliz of Rotan'‘,was 
one among 180 Angelo State 
University students who 
completed degree require­
ments at the conclusion of 
the fall 1976 semester.

Soliz completed work on a 
bachelor of science degree.

Of the 180 graduates, 16 
were awarded masters de­
grees, 46 bachelors of arts, 
40 bachelors of business 
administration and 78 bache­
lors of science.

Diplomas will be mailed to 
students after they are 
received from the engraver.

Walker of Longworth. Jamie 
and his brother Keith were 
the owners of the market 
hogs that competed for 
grand champions. Jamie is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas E. Walker. The

Reserve Champion was 
shown by Todd Goodwin of 
Rotan. He is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Arnie Goodwin. 
The grand champion was a 
240 pound crossbred. The 
reserve champion was a 243

Letter Being Mailed 
Diapause Non-Signers

The Diapause forms are 
still in the seven Fisher 
County gins and will remain 
there until January 20, 
according to Committee 
Chairman Stanley Nowlin. 
“ For the convenience of 
those who have not had an 
opportunity to go by the gin, 
forms are being mailed that 
can be signed and returned” 
said Nowlin.

Nowlin would like to have 
mailed forms returned by 
January 20.

These forms are being 
mailed to all cotton produc­
ers who have not signed a 
form at a gin.

If anyone does not receive 
a form and has not signed 
one, please contact one of 
the committee members or 
the County Agent. Some 
farmers will receive these 
forms even though they have

not planted cotton in the last 
couple of years because the 
records show that they have, 
planted cotton in the past, 
stated Nowlin.

The committee is asking 
for the support of all land 
owners and producers in 
Fisher County.

Bud Wyatt 
Head Of Roby 
Choir Group

The Roby High School 
Choir students elected offi­
cers January 4.

The officers are; Bud 
Wyatt, president; Lupe Cas­
as, vice president; Patricia 
Toole, secretary; Deborah 
Holcomb, reporter; Cindy 
Morgeson and Nora Luna, 
librarians.

streets that branch off 
Highways 70 and 180. This 
project is in cooperation with 
the Texas Highway Depart­
ment. Plans are for the City 
of Roby to purchase the 
street signs and the Highway 
Department to install them 
above the existing stop 
signs.

Another item of business 
was a decision to pay for the 
repair of the city’s Caterpil­
lar from revenue sharing 
funds. The repair cost was 
$2,355.75.

The City of Roby accepted 
a price of $1,000.00 from 
Ronnie Green for the 
purchase of several lots 
within the City limits of Roby 
and voted to send City 
Manager Jimmy Price to a 
Revenue Sharing school in 
Dallas for two days this 
week.

The final item of business 
was a matter brought up by 
Jimmy Price concerning a 
meeting he attended with the 
Fisher County Commission­
ers on Monday morning, 
January 10. Price was told by 

Continued To Page 2
Darden’s Store 
Closing Doors 
Next Monday
Lorena Darden, owner of 

Darden’s Department Store 
in Rotan, has consigned all 
merchandise left at the store 
to the Episcopal Church 
Thrift House in Abilene, 
effective Monday, January 
17.

“ This Thursday, Friday, 
and Satruday will be the final 
three days the store will be 
open with storewide savings 
from 50% to 70% off the 
regular price” , said Mrs. 
Darden.

JAY HENDON

Joel Ackerman 
Takes New Post 
With Thomas Ind.

Joel Ackerman, husband 
of the former Mary Helen 
Martinez and son-in-law of 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Martinez 
of the Hobbs community, has 
accepted the position of 
Southwestern Regional Man­
ager of Thomas Industries. 
Thomas Industries manufac­
turers commercial and resi­
dential lighting.

Ackerman’s duties will be 
to coordinate both indoor and 
outdoor lighting schemes for 
major apartment complexes 
and residentail develop­
ments. He is a graduate of 
the University of Missouri, 
Columbia, Mo., receiving his 
batchelor of business admin­
istration cum laude, and also 
a Big Eight Conference 
All-Star team selection and 
co-captain of the University 
of Missouri football team.

C l a s s i f i e d  
A d s  On P g  11

WTCRegistration 
Begins Jan. 17

Registration will get un­
derway at 1 p.m. on January 
17 for spring semester 
classes at Western Texas 
College.

Sophomores are to register 
between 1-5 p.m. on Jan. 17 
and evening students from 
6:30-9 p.m. on Jan. 17. 
Freshmen will register from 
8 a.m.-12 noon on Jan. 18, 
and registration for all 
students will continue 
through 5 p.m. on Jan. 18.

Classes for day and 
evening students will begin 
on Jan. 19.

Copies of schedules for 
spring semester classes are 
available firom the office of 
the registrar.
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c ’ V
d ;^he 1977 holiday list was
ly a^roved  by Commissioners. 
S Tke Fisher County Court*
F house will close on the
c following dates for holidays:
tl December 31, 1976, New
a l^ears; April 8, 1977, Good
B l^iday; May 30, 1977,
s J^emorial Day; July 4, 1977,
 ̂ Independence Day; Sept. 5,

s 1977, Labor Day; October 24,
i 1977, Veterans Day; Novem-
c her 24 and 25, 1977,
I ' Thanksgiving Day; and Dec. 
I ^  and 27, 1977, Christmas
I i$y-
t ^F&M Chevrolet-Buick of
] ^ t a n  was awarded the bid
j o5 a 1977 Chevrolet Impala
I ?«r the Fisher County
; Sheriff’s Department with a
1 net difference bid of $3,400.
] The only other bidder was
j ^ t a n  Motor Company with a

bjd (net difference) of 
j :p ,650.00.
, ►♦Fisher County Sheriff
I Rickey Counts reported to
I ^ e  Commissioners that

l^cording to the new stand- 
I ^ d s  for jails set up by the

State of Texas, the Fisher 
County Jail does not comply, 
(founts said, “ our jail is not 
ijp to standards.”

Counts indicated that cells 
must have a aminimum of 40 
gq. ft. of unobstructed 
area--the current cells are 
approximately 28 sq. ft. He 
also said that the new 
^andards dictate that jails 
will have a day room, library, 
jiin area for prisoners and an 
^ercise area. Commission­
ers are to study the future 
^ an s for the jail with Counts 
at a later date. 
y  The final item of business 
was a motion to purchase 2 
$hot guns and 1 rifle for the 
jFisher County Sheriff’s De­
partment to be used in the 
department vehicles. The 
Action came after a request 
was made by Sheriff Counts 
^ r  the weapons.

jCanl of Thanks
There are not enough 

j^ords to thank everyone who 
das been so kind to us after 
^ur house burned. Thanks 
again for everything. Also, 

^we wish to thank the Roby 
I^Volunteer Fire Dept, for 
'f^ ing  so hard to save our 
^tpme.

Wayne and Bert Warren

;^ard  of Thanks
want to thank the 

doctors, all the nurses, and 
^^e staff of the hospital, for 
'|feeir care for me. Bro. 
♦^om as, Effie, Phil and Lori 
*lyd all my Christian friends 

their prayers, flowers, 
jl^rds and visits while I was 
;;?ih the hospital. I love you all.

Thelma Keener

;:Card of Thanks
> ■ ■'

The Rotan Primary School 
^ o u ld  like to take this 
xj^portunity to thank each 
1 and every room parent that 
- w iped make the Christmas 
♦ party a success.

We appreciate your time 
f ^ d  concern.

John Harbison, Principal

Roby Commission 
Continued From Page 1

Commissioners that the 
county would pave a road 
leading from the main 
highway to the Roby Ceme­
tery, if the City of Roby 
would pay for the paving of a 
small portion of the road that 
lies within the actual ceme­
tery boundaries. Price relay­
ed this information from the 
Commissioners to the Roby 
Commission. After discus­
sion it was decided that the 
City of Roby did not have any 
money to spend on paving at 
this time. “ We would be 
happy to pave the area if we 
had the money” , said Mayor 
Cecil King, “but unfortun­
ately, the City doesn’t have 
the funds right now.”

Mrs. 0 .Campbell 
Has Holiday 
Travel Guest

Mrs. Orah Campbell join­
ed Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Levens, of Abilene, to share 
the holiday season with the 
rest of her children. They 
went to Yuma, Arizona to 
visit Mr. and Mrs. Truman 
Vittitow until Christmas 
moring. They went to her 
granddaughters, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Etensohn home in 
El Cajon, Calif, and remain­
ed with them until January 2. 
They spent one of their day 
outing at Knotts Berry Farm 
in Anaheim and enjoyed New 
Years day at the Rose Parade 
in Pasadena. They returned 
to Texas via Yuma to spend 
two days more with the 
Vittitows.

Notice
The Roby Board of 

Education makes the follow­
ing response to questions 
asked concerning the Upcom­
ing election to consolidate 
the Hamlin and McCaulley 
Independent School Dis­
tricts:

Should the voters of 
Hamlin and McCaulley Inde­
pendent School Districts vote 
for consolidation the Roby 
Board of Education will 
accept all property owners 
request who desire to annex 
their property to the Roby 
Independent School District. 
Any such action must comply 
with the laws that requires 
that the property involved be 
in single tracts or blocks of 
land owned by several 
persons, be continuous to or 
adjoining the district to 
which it is annexed.

48-ltc
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FABRICS

REDUCED

Roby
Flower, Fabric & Gift Shop

776-2292 776-2613 N irht
P.O. Box A Roby. Texas

IN OOD WE IR liS f

CHURCH OF CHRIST
Rotan, Texas 

Bible Studyc9:45 a.m. 
Worship-10:30 a.m. 

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rotan, Texas
Rev. Cecil M. Tune, pastor 
Sunday School-9:30 a.m. 

Worship-10:30 a.m.
CHURCH OF NAZARENE

Rotan, Texas 
F.W. Rogers, Pastor 
Bible Class-9:45 a.m. 
Worship-10:50 a.m. 

Evening Service-7:00 p.m.

SYLVESTER BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Harold Ely, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m.

Worship-11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Night- 6:00 p.m. 

SARDIS BAPTIST CHURCH 
9 Miles SW of Rotan 

Bro. Henry Dickson, Hawley 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-ll:00 a.m.

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD
Rotan, Texas 

Sunday School-10:00 a.m.
Church-11:00 a.m.

Night Services-7:30 p.m.
CHURCH OF CHRIST
Rotan Latin American 
Bible Class-10:00 a.m. 
Worship-11:00 a.m.

FffiST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH

Sylvester, Texas 
Buddy Payne, Minister 

Morning Worship-9:30 a.m. 
Sunday School-10:30 a.m. 
Sunday Night-7:30 p.m.

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
Rotan, Texas 

David N. Vickers, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-11:00 a.m.

ST. JOSEPH’S CATHOLIC
Rotan, Texas 

John Hoorman, Pastor 
Mass-Saturday Eve.-7:30 p.m. 

Mass-Sunday-9:00 a.m.

LITTLE ZION BAPTIST
Rotan, Texas 

James Carrington, Pastor 
Sunday SchooI-9:45 a.m. 

Worship-11:00 a.m.

CHURCH OF CHRIST
Roby, Texas

Warden Halliburton, Minister 
Bible Class-10:00 a.m. 
Worship-11:00 a.m.

Sunday M o tu la y T u e s d a y W e d n e s d a y T h u r s d a y F r id a y S a tu r d a y
P r o v e r b s P r o v e r b s J a m e s G e n e s is G e n e s is D e u te r o n o m y 1 K in g s
8 :3 2 -3 6 1 6 :1 -9 3 : 1 3 - 1 8 2 2 :1 -1 8 3 5 :1 -1 5 4 : 3 2 - 4 0  1 8 : 2 0 - 3 9

Scnptures selected by The Amencan able Society............. ............ tkii
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FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH

McCaulley, Texas 
David Binkley, Minister 

Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 
Worship-11:00 a.m.

This Church Page Is Published In Hope That More People Will Attend Church. It Is Paid For By Firms 
and Individuals 100% Interested In This County. Let Them Know That You Appreciate Them Supporting 
This Page. Each Week We Feature One Supporter In Hope That You Will Make A Special Effort To Let 
Your Appreciation Be Known To This Church Page Supporter._______________________________

.S WEEK’S FEATURE SUPPORTER

Sweetwater Prod. Credit

EMMANUEL 
BAPTIST CHURCH

Rotan, Texas 
Sunday School-lO.OO a.m. 

Worship-11:00 a.m.
CROSS ROADS BAPTIST

6 Miles S W of Rotan 
Michael H. Hicks, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-ll:00 a.m.

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH

Roby, Texas
Rev. Luther Baker, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-ll:00 a.m.
HOBBS BAPTIST CHURCH

Hobbs Community 
L.D. (Dutch) Parks, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-ll:00 a.m.
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH

Roby, Texas
Rev. Allen Cartrite, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-ll:00 a.m.

FOURSQUARE CHURCH
Rotan, Texas 

Eighth and Genevieve 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-ll:00 a.m.
EL PASO

BAPTIST CHURCH
South of Roby 

F.E. Healer, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-11:00 a ^ .  
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rptan, Texas 
Rev; Fred Thomas, Pastor 
Sunday School-9:45 a.m. 

Worshp-10:55 a.m.
METHODIST CHURCH

Longworth, Texas 
Ivan Allen, Minister 

Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 
Worship-11:00 a.m;

LONGWORTH BAPTIST
Longworth, Texas 

Rev. Billy Oliver, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-11:00 a.m.

McCaulley baptist
McCaulley, Texas 

Rev. George Caffey, Pastor 
Sunday School-10:00 a.m. 

Worship-ll:00 a.m.

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Roby, Texas 
Elder J.R. Knight 

Song Serv. 10 a.m.-4th Sunday 
Worship-11 a.m.-4th Sunday

Sweetwater 
Prod. Credit

Dwayin Parker - Vice President 
776-2311 - Roby, Texas

Central
Lumber & Supply

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Matthies 
776-2371 - Roby, Texas

Dairy Queen
Mr. and Mrs. B.J. Waddell 

735-2227

Crestview Lodge
711 East 5th 
Rotan, Texas

Martinez Dairy
Rudy, Joe B. & Emilio Martinez 

Hobbs. Texas

RockweU 
Bros. & Co.

“LUMBERMEN”

Bart Strayhom
735-2231 

Rotan, Texas

Landes Fnmitnre
Loys Landes - Larry Landes 

Rotan, Texas

Trail’s End
735-3575 

Rotan, Texas

Fisher
County Farm Bureau

215 West Snyder 
Rotan, Texas

Roby
Insurance Agency

776-2361 
Roby, Texas

Clinic Pharmacy
Cleburne Murdoch, R. PH. 

735-2500

Farmers
Union Co-Op Gin

Foy Mitchell, Manager 
Roby, Texas

H jL .  Davis'& 
Co.

Bill and Elaine Day 
Rotan, Texas

Rotan Motor Co.
Ford and Mercury

Dono and Lorena 
Darden

First National Bank 
Of Rotan

Accounts Insured To !40,000 
735-2224

Roby Hydro Inc.
Bettie and Archie Rivers 

Roby, Texas

Rotan
Insurance Agency

Joe Bnrit, Agent 
Rotan, Texas

Hinds
Department Store

Gold Bond Stamps 
Rotan, Texas

Midwest 
Electric Roby

776-2244 
Roby, Texas

Home Luniber Co.
' Mr. and Mrs. H. Thompson 

Rotan, Texas

Citizens Statei Bank
Roby, Texas 

Member F.D.I.C.

Weathersbee 
Funeral Home

735-2255 
Rotan, Texas

Fisher
Nursing Home County

735-3291 
Rotan, Tevas

Hatahoe Drive Inn
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Ragan 

Rotan, Texas

Rotan
Paint & Body Shop

Mr. and Mrs. Carlton Butcvm 
Rotan, Texas

Nides
Drug Store

Roby, Tezaa
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Rotan Board Seeks To Decrease Utility Bill
Members of the Rotan' 

School Board voted to hold 
joint elections with the City, 
of Rotan, Water Board and 
Fisher County Hospital 
Board at their meeting last 
Monday night.
: According to Superintend­

ent Tom Harkey, “ In hopes 
of eliminating some of the 
confusion that existed last

year, the board felt it proper 
to hold a joint election” , said 
Harkey. “ We also hope it 
will encourage participation 
from voters” , added Harkey.

In other action the Rotan 
School Board voted to accept 
a proposal by Johnson 
Controls Inc., of Lubbock, for 
up-grading the heating and 
cooling systems in the high

Vester Smith New 
Farm Bureau Director

A Gaines County farmer is 
now serving on the board of 
directors of the 195,571- 
member Texas Farm Bu­
reau.

He is Vester Smith of Loop 
who grows cotton, milo and 
peanuts on 2,700 acres. He 
owns 700 acres and rents the 
remainder. He also owns a 
cotton gin with nine other 
men.

The new board member 
from TFB’s District 6 
succeeds Bill R. Reid of 
Lamesa who was ineligible 
for re-election due to the 
six-year limitation in TFB’s 
by-laws. Smith was elected 
at the recent TFB convention 
in Fort Worth.

Born at Quemado on the 
South Texas border. Smith 
graduated from Loop High 
School in 1952 and attended 
a business college in Lub­
bock.

He was president of the 
Gaines County Farm Bureau 
in 1971-72, and has served as 
secretary-treasurer for the 
past four years. He was a 
member of the first TFB 
Young Farmers and Ranch­
ers Advisory Committee.

Smith also served one year 
as chairman of the TFB 
Cotton Advisory Committee 
and on the American Farm 
Bureau Federation Cotton 
Committee.

A member of the Church 
of Christ, he is married to the 
former Irene Burnett and 
they have four children: Mrs. 
Brenda Abies, Timmy, Dane 
and Michille.

Counties in TFB’s District 
6 include: Coke, Concho, 
Culberson, Dawson, El Paso, 
Fisher, Gaines, Howard, 
Hudspeth, Martin, Menard, 
Midland, Mitchell, Nolan, 
Pecos, Reeves, Scurry and 
Tom Green.

school building.
“There has not been any 

scheduled maintenance on 
the systems by competent 
people since the building 
was built” , said Harkey. 
“ We hope that by schedul­
ing some preventative main­
tenance, we will eliminate an 
extremely costly repair bill in 
the future. The s;^stem is still 
basically in good working 
order and with continued 
maintenance we will hopeful­
ly eliminate those large 
repair bills in years to 
come” , said Harkey.

The cost of getting the 
system ip top working order 
is not to exceed $4,500.00. 
The board, in a separate 
motion, also agreed to 
employ Johnson Control 
personnel on an hourly basis 
($21.00) plus .21 cents a mile 
and $20.00 a day expenses to 
perform semi-annual main­
tenance repairs and inspec­
tions.

“ We know that we are 
using more energy now than

we would with a properly 
functioning system” , said 
Harkey. He hopes to cut the 
gas and electric bills that 
have doubled in the last 
year, whenever the system is 
repaired and working at 100 
percent efficiency.

In other action Harkey 
informed the board of the 
education bills pending and 
scheduled for action by the 
legislature. He outlined the 
bills and the possible effects 
they would have on the 
Rotan School District.

The board also discussed 
the consolidation vote sched­
uled for Saturday, January 
15, between the Hamlin and 
McCaulley schools.

In final action the board 
discussed the contracts of 
Superintendent Tom Harkey 
and Principals Neil Wright, 
Marshall Hill and John 
Harbison. Football coach, 
Don Mullins’ contract was 
also reviewed. Action on the 
contracts will be taken at the 
February board meeting.

Proposed F.M . Hwy. 
3339 In County Ok’d

Shelley Boyd Is Top 
Scorer For Roby “ B”

The Roby JV girls basket­
ball team entered the Jayton 
JV tourney over the weekend 
and came out with two 
losses. The girls were 
missing a couple of starters 
and this really slowed down 
the offense.

In the first round game 
Roby lost to Jayton by the 
score of 30-23. Leading the 
scoring for Roby was Shelley 
Boyd with 15 points, follow- 

;ed by Michelle Cox 4 points. 
Sue Hall 2 points and Jackie 
Shipp 2 points.

In second round action 
Roby lost to Roscoe by the 
score of 32-25. Leading the 
scoring for Roby was Shelley 

; Boyd with 13 points, Jackie 
Shipp 7 points, Michelle Cox 
2 points, Donna Hataway

and Sue Hall 1 point each.
During the tournament 

strong defensive perform­
ances were turned in by 
Donna Hataway, Sylvia Ga- 
ona, Kathy Deaton, Jan 
Wright, Vickey Shipp and 
Linda Hoodenpyle.

State Department of High­
ways and Public Transporta­
tion officials announced 
today that the location and 
design of proposed F.M. 
Highway 3339 in Fisher 
County has been approved 
by the Austin Office.

The proposed project will 
begin at F.M. High way 92, 
approximately 2.1 miles west 
of F.M. Highway 540, and 
proceed in a southeasterly 
direction for approximately 
5.1 miles, terminating at 
F.M. Highway 2142. The 
proposed route will follow 
existing county roads except 
at two curves, and will have 
an asphalt surface 20 feet 
wide. The proposed right-of- 
way width is 100 feet.

A public meeting was held

Roby Demolishes 
Hermleigh 89-15

September 28, 1976, in
Hamlin to inform the public 
of the project and to seek 
public input into the project.

The opportunity for a 
formal public hearing was 
given, but since there was no 
request by the public to hold 
one, approval was granted 
for continuing the project.

Roger Welsch, District 
Engineer for the Abilene 
District, stated, “ With this 
approval, work can now be 
started on plan development 
and right-of-way purchases. 
Right-of-way for the project 
will be purchased by Fisher 
County.” Welsch stated, 
“ At this point we are unable 
to determine the length of 
time right-of-way purchases 
and plan development will 
take. Our most optimistic 
estimate of contract date is 
June, 1977.”

' The Roby girls traveled to 
Hermleigh last Friday and 
came out on top by 89-15. 
Leading the scoring for Roby 
was Cheryl Terry with 28 
points, followed by Penny 
Coker with 26 points, Cindy 
King 19 points, Susan

Matthies 9 points 
Shelley Boyd 9 points.

and

Fine defensive performan­
ces were turned in by 
Rhonda Welch, Tina Horton, 
Kim Faught, Lois Ann 
Cauble and Sylvia Gaona.
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Roby Board Names Palmer Committee Head
The Roby School Board 

voted to purchase insurance 
on the Roby Gym, appoint 
J.T. Palmer as the head of 
the * committee to seek 
residents to run for the 
school board and discussed 
the*  H am lin -M cC aulley  
school district consolidation 
at their meeting last Mon­
day.

The board accepted the 
low bid of $2,713.00 from 
Roby Insurance Agency for 
$100,000 coverage on the 
gym for a three year period. 
The only other bid was from 
Deaton Insurance Agency for 
$3,325.00.

The board voted to award 
the liability insurance on the 
school buses to the Deaton

Agency.
J.T. Palmer will head the 

committee to secure Roby 
Independent School district 
residents to allow their 
names to be placed on the 
ballot for school trustees.

The board approved the 
first Saturday in April (April 
2) as the date of the trustee 
election. Rose Moore was

DAR Honors 1976-77 
Good Citizens Here

The annual DAR Good 
Citizen contest is a nation­
wide, program of the National 
Society of Daughters of the 
Revolution im plemented 
through the local chapters. It 
is open to students in the 
senior class of an accredited 
public high school. DAR 

Good Citizens of three of the 
schools of Fisher County are 
being announced by Anne 
Pettus Shelburne Chapter 
of Rotan. Mrs. Bobby 
Gruben is chapter chairman.

DAR Good Citizens are 
chosen for qualities of 
DepOndability-'which inclu­
des . truthfullness. loyalty, 
punctuality; Service cooper­
ation. courtesy, considera­
tion of others: Leadership- 
personality. self control, 
ability to assume responsibil­
ity; and Patriotism-unselfish 
interest in family, school, 
community and nation. En- 
trys; must be citizens of the 
United States who finish 
school in the second semes­
ter.

Recommended method of 
selection is to have the senior 
class choose three students 
and; from the three the 
facility choses one who 
becomes the school’s Good 
Citizen. The name is submit­
ted by the sponsoring 
chapter chairman to the state 
ch^rman. Each State winner 
receives a $100.00 Savings 
Bond, Series E, and the right 
to compete at the national 
level. The National DAR 
Good Citizen each year 
receives an engraved Paul 
Revere Silver Bowl and a 
$100.00 Scholarship to the 
college or university of their 
choke.

T^e 1976-77 DAR Good 
Citijren of Hobbs High School 
is Bertha Miranda. Bertha is 
the; daughter of Lazaro and 
Eustobia Miranda. She is 
active in her church and 
coirimunity as well as school 
activities. Bertha enjoys 
sports, working with ceram­
ics .^nd helping others. She 
tea<4ies in the Sunday School 
classes of her church and is 
pr^ident of the High School

department. After gradua­
tion she plans to attend San 
Angelo State University.

Dianna DeLosSantos, dau­
ghter of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
DeLosSantos, is the DAR 
Good Citizen from Roby- 
High School. She, too, is 
active in school, church and 
community. She has a 
special love and interest in 
music. Dianna has been a 
member of the Roby Band 
for eight years and has 
served as band president and 
sweetheart. She has also 
served as choir president and 
has been listed in Who’s 
Who in American Music. 
Her future plans include two 
years of college and a career 
as a secretary or accountant.

Dee Ann Weathersbee, 
Rotan High School’s DAR 
Good Citizen, is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Mac

Weathersbee. Dee Ann has 
maintained a high grade 
point average during her 
school career. She is in the 
‘Top Five’ scholastically in 
her class. She has also been 
active in her church serving 
in the Youth Choir, Youth 
Council, the Nominating and 
Budgeting Committees and 
as a Bible School leader. Her 
special interests are sewing 
and music. Following high 
school graduation. Dee Ann 
plans to attend Baylor 
University in preparation for 
a career in teaching.

Members of Anne Pettus 
Shelburne Chapter are proud 
to honor these good citizens 
from the high schools of 
Fisher County, and to 
participate in this program 
sponsored by the National 
Society Daughters of the 
American Revolution.

named by the board as the 
election judge with clerks to 
be Inez Neves, Lois Terry 
and Juanita Gaona. D.L. 
Lovett will be asked to serve 
as the absentee judge.

In final action the board 
discussed the consolidation 
election set for Saturday, 
January 15, between the 
Hamlin and McCaulley 
School districts. Should the 
vote for consolidation receive 
voter approval, the board 
issued the following state­
ment concerning annexation.

“ Should the voters of 
Hamlin and McCaulley Inde­
pendent School Districts vote 
for consolidation, the Roby 
Board of Education will 
accept all property owners 
request who desire to annex 
their property to the Roby- 
Independent School District. 
Any such action must comply 
with the laws that requires 
that the property involved be 
in single tracts or blocks of 
land owned by several 
persons, be continuous to or 
adjoining the district to 
which it is annexed’’.

National Gypsum 
Wins An Appeal

llu. 1 ( licral Appeals 
tom  I. I’l.ilailelphia, Pa.. 
riAi-rsi'd a iur\ verdict 
li.mded dou ii it: PtUshiirg in 
luK. lltal tonnd
N.uional (c.mpanv.
Its loinni vi'iiet <.\eimi\<.' 
nltui'I. .t titll'.ll l ! l \ l s t o I l a l  
\ Kv pieMiU til. aiul tilhers 
yiiillv ol \iuiaiine thi. 
aniilrusi law. I Iw appeal 
panel h>mul tlt.ii t rrors had 
been emnmiileel h\ the judge 
during the course ol the iri.d 
evhieh were signif leant 
eiieuigh to cause tlie jurv's 
verdict to be overturned. The 
Court ordered the case 
remanded for a new trial.

ROTAN VARSITY BASKETBALL TEAM

Social Security People Will Earn More In 1977
People under 72 can work 

and earn more and still get 
their social security benefits 
starting this year, according 
to M.Glyn Hammons, social 
security district manager in 
Abilene.

“ In 1977 people can earn 
as much as $3,000 and get 
their full social security 
retirement or survivors bene­
fit’’, Hammons said. “ The 
yearly earnings limit for 1976 
was $2,760, The increase 
keeps the amount in line with 
inereases in general average 
w-ages.’’

For earnings over $3,000

in 1977, social security 
benefits will be reduced by 
$1 for every $2 earned. “ But 
no matter how much people 
earn for the year,” Ham­
mons said, “ they can get 
their full social security 
benefit for any month in 
which they neither earn over 
$250 nor do substantial work 
in their own business.’’ The 

monthly earnings limit 
was $230.

Different rules applv to 
disabled people v\ho are 
getting social security disa­
bility benefits. “ And people 
72 and over will continue to

get their full social security- 
benefits regardless of earn­
ings.’’ Hammons noted.

Peope who earn over 
$2,760 and get benefits in 
1976 must send a report on 
1976 earnings to social 
security by April 15. 1977.

The social security- tax rate 
remains the same in 1977-- 
5.55 percent of covered

wages paid by employees* 
and employers; 7.9 percent ' 
of covered self-employed 
income. -

The earnings and contri­
butions base—the amount on ■ 
which social security contri-’ 
butions are made-will be the ' ** 
first $16,500 of covered^*' 
earnings for the year it.' 
starting in January. The 1976^^7, 
base was $15.300. -

BERTHA MIRANDA AND DIANNA DELOSSANTOS

Girl Scout Cookie 
Sales Begin Today

I  E N R O L L  NOW
I  ■' P a i n t i n g  L e s s o n s
R Beginners To Advanced Artist
H  ̂ 3 Hour Lessons Begin At
I  -^:00 A. xM. -1 :00 P.  M.  & 4 :0 0  P.  M.
S - S c h o o l  S t u d e n t s  L e s s o n s  
8 . (!»'o , F r o m  4 :0 0  to  7 : 0 0 ’P.  M.

I  M A R I E S  A R T  S T U D I O
8 7 3 5 - 2  316 R o t a n ,  T e x a s

CARPET!
We Have A Good Supply Of Fine 

Quality Carpet At Reasonable Prices 

Professionai Carpet Installers 

Offer Guaranteed Sa tisfaction

S E E  U S  F O R  A L L  Y O U R  C A R P E T  N E E D S

LANDES FURNITURE
R O T A N ,  T E X A S

January 12 and 13th arc 
the dates set for the 1977 
Cookie Iraining luncheons 
for the West Texas Girl Scout 
C'oimcil.

George S. Barron. Jr., 
representative of the Famous 
Foods of Virginia; Rich­
mond, Virginia will host two 
luncheons for adults who will 
be responsible for conduct­
ing the Cookie Sale in the 
four areas of the Council.

The Service Unit Chairman 
and Cookie Chairman of each 
town have the choice of 
attending one of two lunch­
eons to receive sales infor­
mation and selling aids for 
each of their troops:

Wednesday, Jan. 12, Co­
kers Restaurant. 309 Benton, 
Big Spring.

Thursday. Jan. 13, Jama­
ica Inn, 3161 S. 23rd, 
Abilene,

LANDES FURNITURE
735-3171 Rotan, Texas
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Meditations
Rotan M in ister ia l  A l l ia n c e

Cecil M. Tune, pastor 
First Methodist Church

¥ Rotan Girls Drop Big
i  Game to Crowell Team
¥

Dear Editor:
As a senior at McCaulley 

High School, I would like to 
give my point of view on the 
proposed consolidation of 
our school.

I have lived in McCaulley 
all of my life, and for the 
most part of this time my 
mother was a teacher at the 
school. Ever since I was old 
enough to be dragged 
around I have gone to all 
school functions, and I know 
how important our school has 
been to a number of kids.

Here the teachers are on a 
more personal basis with 
their students and can, 
therefore, give them more 
help. I also want to add that 
even though few of our 
teachers actually live in 
McCaulley, they are all a 
working part of our commu­
nity and attend and work 
with many outside activities 
in our community. I also 
would like each person who 
is for consolidation to visit 
our school one day for a short 
time to see all the work our 
faculty and students have 
put into our school and the 
pride they have in what they 
have accomplished.

On a more personal basis,
I think that closing down this 
little school would seriously 
affect the pride and success 
our school has had in the 
last few years in building up 
both our school and our 
community. Even though as 
a senior the proposed 
consolidation wouldn’t affect 
me personally, it would 
affect a lot of my friends, and 
I would lose a lot of fond 
memories I have stored up 
over the years.

Max Kemp
****

Dear Editor:
Please renew my subscrip­

tion for 1977. I would ride a 
buffalo ten miles for the 
Advance.

You’ll find enclosed my 
Cayce Realty Co. check. If 
there is any change left over 
you may take your wife out 
for a hamburger. If it’s not 
enough, bill me.

Gayle Cayce 
Cayce Realty Co.

4010 Whitman 
Houston, Tex. 77027 

P.S. Be sure it’s your wife. 
****

Dear Editor:
I am an eighth grader at 

McCaulley Independent 
School District, and I would 
like to express my opinion of 
the consolidation between 
McCaulley and Hamlin.

1 think McCaulley has an 
excellent administration and 
I also think it is as good as 
any school in Texas. My 
teacher graduated from Mc­
Caulley and is one of the best 
teachers I have had. Many 
educated people have gradu­
ated from McCaulley and 
have gone to college and 
received degrees. In my 
opinion I think you could take 
any two children from 
McCaulley and match with 
any two from another school 
and ours would be just as 
smart or smarter. I love 
McCaulley and hope to stay

here with your help.
Sincerely yours, 

Britt Jeffrey

Dear Editor:
I don’t think McCaulley 

Schools should be consolidat­
ed with Hamlin or anyother 
public schools. McCaulley is 
small so the teachers can 
help you if the need be. I 
have always gone to a bigger 
school and I feel like you 
have a better opportunity to 
learn in a small school.

' I feel like consolidation is 
or would be depriving the 
students of both McCaulley 
and Hamlin Schools of 
getting the utmost in their 
education and schooling.

Michael Vinson, 
Freshman, McCaulley 

High School

Dear Sir:
Please excuse me for not 

mailing in my check for the 
paper. I have had so much 
company it just slipped my 
mind. I don’t want to miss 
one issue. Thanks,

Gracie J. Tankersley

LETTER TO EDITOR

Christmas In Iran -1976

We are wishing you a very 
special Merry Christmas 
from our home to yours. We 
hope you had a very good old 
year and that the New Year 
will bring much joy and 
happiness. God be with e 
and ef"

Americans rent, and apart 
from what the rent appears 
to you, it is rather average in 
comparison to what the other 
Americans pay. Most homes 
in Iran, and especially in 
Tehran, are surrounded by 
5-8 foot high walls, sow those 
who are fearful to venture 
outside their walls are 
virtually lost as you never 
learn who is on the outside.

The Iranians are either 
rich or poor. A middle class 
is non-existant. For the most 
part, the Iranians are very 
friendly and helpful. Our 
landlord and their children 
have been life-savers since 
this is the first fo|:eign 
country where neither us 
speak the language. We 
have, however, been able to 
get by a little on our Turkish 
language. The Iranians all 
want to learn the English 
language and vist the United 
States (so do we), so they do 
make attempts to speak to 
the Americans. Of course, 
the terrorist situations here 
have caused most Americans 
to be extremely cautious as 
to who they socialize with.

Since there is no military 
base, per se, the children 
attend the Tehran-American 
School and seem to enjoy it 
very much. Shaun has been 
extremely active in youth 
sports activities (scoring his 
first touchdown in football 
this year) but he is still not 
academically interested. Na­
talie, on the other hand, is 

Iv ^ o in e jo  he the

11

of 
fror 
str^ 
s’ oc 
be 
Kar>
On/Î ^
IramaiTToad^'will convince 
anyone that the true origin of 
Kamikazi is, in fact, Iran. 
(They don’t drive-they just 
aim the vehicle and go; even 
the female-libers make way 
for the male chauvinist 
drivers.)

Iran is truly beautiful. 
Apart from one’s thoughts of 
Iran being all desert, our 
front windows face the 
mountains north of Tehran 
which are currently dressed 
in lovely white snow. Don’t 
let this fool you however, 
because we did experience 
an average 105-109 degree 
summer. Tehran can best be 
described as an oasis in the 
desert. Green grass and 
trees are in everyone’s yard, 
yet just outside the city limits 
every piece of land is dirt, 
sand and dried up vegeta­
tion. Housing is plentiful, 
but quite expensive. We pay 
approxim ately $1,000.00 
monthly, plus utilities. We 
live in a five bedroom, living 
room, dining room, two 
bathroom, single kitchen, 
second floor apartment. The 
rear balcony has a stairwell 
to the yard and swimming 
pool, which we share with 
our downstairs landlord. We 
live JrL _ typical unit

rwnirc
or the kids since I do not 
drive yet awaiting the arrival 
of our car from Japan. We’re 
currently renting an Iranian 
make vehicle, called Peykan. 
It’s a pretty inexpensively 
made vehicle which Jim 
refers to as his “ rent-a- 
wreck” . I’m having quite a 
vacation while Jim drives the 
kids around. I’m sure he’ll 
be quite happy when our car 
does arrive and I can share in 
the driving chores.

Doing Christmas shopping 
in Iran is really a hassle. The 
shops open at 9:00 and you 
just seem to get out there, 
find the right store and begin 
shopping your heart out, 
wracking your brain trying to 
call on your two or three 
words of Persian language, 
when BAM, it’s 1:00 and all 
the stores close. They open 
again at 4:00 and stay open 
till about 7:00 in the evening. 
They must do their siesta 
during the interim periods.

We do have television here 
and the programs are not 
half bad. We have an

international channel, so we 
get the news in English, 
German or French, depend­
ing on who the announcer is 
for the evening. The Iranian 
stations have some programs 
with the English language 
sound track on one of the FM 
radio stations. They do not 
have color television here, 
and after being in Japan 
where the color was really 
the best in the world, it sort 
of takes out the pleasure of 
TV. Then there is the 
aggrivation of the 8-story 
apartment building next door 
to us blocking out what 
reception we do receive. 
After several trips to the top 
of the apartment building 
(eight flights of stairs), and 
two TV anteneas later, we do 
have fair reception.

With all the aggrivation of 
getting to and from, the 
straffic snarls, the language 
barrier, etc., we really are 
enjoying Iran. Jim loves his 
work here and travels TDY 
once every 5 or 6 weeks to 
other areas. I work two days 
a week for Max Factor at the 
U.S. Embassy Co-op; it’s 
really different and quite an 
experience.

This year we will not be 
celebrating New Year’s Eve, 
as it is the holiest day of 
mourning in Iran (Muslim 
religion). There can be no 
parties, music or loud noise, 
in respect for their religion. 
So we will probably welcome 
the new year in one the 29th.

celebrating the 
make a little noise

REGULAR OR SUPER
1^01 about it for this

Deen an interesting

I  K r  wait to see what’s 
TER L IN G U A try  to keep busy 

weekends in the 
the week sure help 

e time fly. We 
all have a very 
stmas and a most 

ew Year.
Fondest regards, 

Jim, Shirley and kids 
EDITORS NOTE: The

above letter was received 
from Jim and Shirley Stout. 
Mrs. Stout is the granddau­
ghter of the late Emory 
Keener.

PINTOS

“ I AM RESOLVED-” 
said a Biblical character 
whose exploits are recorded 
in Luke 16, and hereby sets 
for us at this time of year, an 
idea which has taken consid­
erable ridicule in this 
modern day, mostly because 
it has become so ineffective. 
But whatever we may say for 
or against it, this time of year 
still brings us face to face 
with it, and any possible 
implications it may offer. 
Our character in this story 
needed some devious way of 
getting himself out of the 
jam he was in. so he 
purposed, and carried out, a 
scheme which saved him 
from disgrace. This, of 
course, must not be our 
reason tor making New 
Years resolutions, but for the 
good of our Lord and His 
kingdom. Three things need 
t(T be considered to make this 
function desirable and use­
ful;

A CONSTANT RESOLVE 
is always of great vaue, 
especially when applied to 
our lives li\ed in His Grace. 
Many people have allowed 
New Years resolutions do 
become laughing stocks, 
because nobody, now, seems 
to expect them tb be 
kept-dnly broken. Of course, 
as long as we are imperfect 
creatures, (and we always 
will be), then our good 
resolves will, at times, suffer 
defeat. BUT, the grace of 
God leads to forgiveness, 
and a new start—whatever 
the tim eof year-is in order. 
So, defeat must always be 
only temporary! Some of the 
greatest Apostles of the 
Christian Faith have been 
men of stumbling, such as 
St. Peter, but whent he final 
chapter is written, they 
efnerge shining with Hea­
venly Glory. Then:

This Resolve will be FOR 
BETTERMENT. “ Practice 
makes perfect” is a trite 
statement of our day, but it is 
still worthy of consideration; 
the more we follow God’s 
Commands, Itste®* to,; and 
hear His Voice, the fuller is 
our understanding of His 
wishes, and the better our 
chance of pleasing Him and 
improving ourselves. Dr. 
Steele, formerly of^ Dallas, 
tells the story of the

Rotan Girls Squeak 
By Munday, JV ’s Lose

The Rotan varsity girls got 
by Munday 38-37 on January 
4th after trailing for three 
and one-half quarters. The 
forwards only managed 15 of 
51 shots in the game.

Ginger Duke and Chatee 
Smith tied for high pont 
individual player when each 
tallied 10 points. Susie 
McKinney had 6 poinis, 
Blanch Gentry had 4 aad 
Caroly Byrd 2 points.

Sonya Leverton had 20 bdl 
advances while Melody Wal­
ker had 4 and Jill Hill 6.

In the Junior Varsity gaire

Munday outscored Rotan 44 
to 42 tO'hand the Rotan girls 
their third defeat of the year. 
Cindy Weathersbee and C. 
Jones each had 12 points 
with Regina Pearson collect­
ing 2 points. The high scorer 
for the game was Cindy 
Williams with 17 points.

Renee Underwood had 5 
ball advances; Carmen 
Sparks had 2 steals; Tina 
McCombs had 9 advances 
and Remona Pearson had 16 
advances.

Monika Stucki had one 
steal in the game.

i k # i

HUNTS 32 O Z

CATSUP
now for i-f.

msICOlA

3 2

IPPI

NEWSPAPER OFFICE 
735-2562

©1976 Ambassador Cards.
I division Of Hetfmork Cords, Inc.^

Bredemeyer's 
Trenching Service
P .V .C (P lastic) Pipe

'Water Lines Installed  
Fo undations Dug

For All Your Trenching Needs 
See or Call

Law ren ce  D redem eyer

discouraged lady with a bad 
temper, ready to give up, 
until he showed her the 
alternative, and she, very 
wisely, felt the need for 
“ keeping on” , thereby find­
ing a real victory. Stronger 
each day we grow as long as 
the strength we use is the 
“ right” ! AND 

SPIRITUAL POWER will 
then be ours to do the things 
we need to do for God’s 
Work: teaching Sunday
School class, leading another 
portion of the Church in its 
organizational form, witness­
ing to others of our Faith in 
Christ, or any other task 
which we may feel compelled 
to do. SO

NEAR YEARS RESOLU­
TIONS ARE FINE, but they 
must be lived day by day in 
the strength of His Might! 
This we not only can do, but 
MUST!

Texas Tech To 
Hold Spring 
Registration

Registration for the Spring 
semester at Texas Tech 
University will be reduced to 
two days, 8 a.m.-5 p.m,, 
Thursday, Jan, 13, and 8 
a.m.-6 p.m., Friday, Jan. 14.

It will be conducted in the 
Lubbock Municipal Coli­
seum. D.N. Peterson, inter­
im director of Admissions 
and Records and Registrar, 
has asked all academic 
departments to increase the 
number of faculty section- 
izers necessary to handle the 
work load, which was 
previously spread over three 
days.

Late registration will be 
conducted the following 
week from departmental 
offices and the officeof the 
Registrar, Peterson said.

There still is student- 
housing available in most of 
the residence halls, said Bill 
Haynes, manager of Resi­
dence Halls Operation.

A disasterous first quarter 
that only produced 5 points 
resulted in the Rotan girls 
varsity team losing to 
Crowell 59-45 last Friday 
night.

“ Our guards just weren’t 
adjusting to their fast break 
in the first quarter” , said 
Coach Sonny Barnes.

Scoring by quarters saw 
Rotan get 5, 15, 12, and 13 
for a 45 total. While Crowell 
had 16, 15, 14 and 14 for a 
total of 59 points.

“ As the scoring by 
quarters shows, Rotan stay­
ed right with the team that 
leads all others for the 
district championship for the 
final three quarters” , said 
Barnes.

Ginger Duke scored 22 
points, Jamie Strickland 13, 
Blanch Gentry and Charee 
Smith 4 each, and Susie 
McKinney 2 points in the 
contest.

Defensively Cheryl Jones, 
Jill Hill and Sonya Leverton 
each had 14 ball advances. 
Melody Walker had 2 
advances and 1 rebound 
while Jamie Strickland was 
credited with 2 assists.

In the junior varsity 
contest Rotan increased their 
record to 12-3 by defeating 
Crowell 32 to 19.

Cindy Weathersbee had 13

Savings Bond 
Report Given

October sales of Series E 
and H United States Savings 
Bonds in Fisher county were 
reported recently. Sales for 
the nine-month period total­
ed $47,187 for 79 percent of 
the 1976 sales goal of 
$60,000.

Texas sales during the 
month amounted to $21,175,- 
451, while sales for the first 
nine months of 1976 totaled 
$232,326,820 with 85 percent 
of the yearly sales goal of 
$272.4 million achieved.

points, Donna Smith 12 and 
Cindy Williams 7 points.

Tina McCombs had 6 
steals, Remona Pearson 11 ‘ 
rebounds and Patti Williams 
10 ball advances.

T

^ 3
P

So you dreamed x 
your brand-new car 
careened downhill and 
plowed into a shoe 
store?

And you had the 
wrong coverage for this 
kind of accident?

Stop worrying.
Head straight for the 
person who can make 
sure things are 
straight: your inde­
pendent insurance 
agent.

If we
can’t help 

you,
nobody 

can.

Rotan
Insurance Atancy

J o e  p .  Burk  
P e g s y  Morrow  

C.D .(M onk) Herrotv 
J a n ie  Ph il l ip s

GROCERY
Roby, Texai

O P E N  6 D A Y S  A W E E K  (C lo se d  Sund ay)  
W e  R e s e rv e  T h e  Right To Limit

McBeth Medium

Eggs
Lim it 2 dozen

doz.

IVJ-
101b. bag

Potatoes bag

Pinto

Beans .

Avocada 6 $1.00
Delicious

Apples 29( .

1 Oranges 10/$1
1 Slab

Bacon 99C„
Salt

Jowl 39c ,J
1 Round

Steak 29,
Tyson Chicken Q A a  I
Franks

12 oz. pkg.j

Ul
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t o G r a n d  O p e n i n g

i SfAMPS
■ .rv

i i• XSCJL̂ Z ♦ 
i STAMPS :
: Wt cSvi’ i

: STAMPS \ 
: WS CIVI :

WESTERN GIFT STORE
220 W. SNYDER ROTAN, TEXAS

DOUBLE STAMPS
i

Thursday January 13 Thru Wednesday January 19th

STAMPS
 ̂\ I bi5K

STAMPS 

WE 6IVE

I \
: STAMPS
. ... •
: WE GIVE

WE GIVE

: STAMPS :I 1̂4 ••••••••••«•#
I WE c m :

STAMPS THRIFTWAY

STAMPS : 
WE GIVE :

STAMPS *: ...........
WE GIVE :

: STAMPS
: wf oivi

5 STAMPS

D«ar Mrs. Housewife,

This, is to introduce you to Circle W Blue Stamps. .  . the 
newest and most valuable available to stamp-savers.

More valuable? Read this exciting news closely. Only 1,200 
stamps fill your book*(same as S&H; Gold Bond booklets has 
1,500 stamps). Now, here's the "extra value" for you.

We will have a local Western Gift Store for your shopping 
convenience. No catalog item will ever be available at a lower 
number of stamps than In the Western Gift Store.

Now hear this! Your full Blue Saver Booklet will be worth $2.50 
on any merchandise in our store . . .  let us point out quickly that 
all merchandise will have retail values only. But look how they 
will be priced! Other 1200 stamp books say a one book Item has. 
a retail value of $ 3 . 0 0 . . .  the same item vvill be priced at 
Western Gifts for only $2.50, thus costing the same number of 
stamps,

Also, if you pay the cash difference, it will be at the lower 
discounted prices.

Here's more! You can gift shop, or pay the cash difference 
with Master Charge or Bank-Americard at your Western Gift 
Stores. . .

Plus, you get Blue  Stamps on 1̂1 casii purchases in the 
Western Gift Stores.

Now the most valuable bonus, me largest possible number of 
special and seasonal merchandise for your selection. Greater 
selection means areater value. Yes, we have a conventional stamp 
catalog for even a greater selection.

WE GIVE

WE GIVE :■

STAMPS

WE GIVI

STAMPS FAIRY DRUfi

: STAMPS : 

; WE GIVE

STAMPS STAMPS 

WE GIVI

: STAMPS 

: w i  GIVI

I C E

DARDEN'S 
DEPARTMENT T'
Will Close, Mô

---------------------  <  H

STAMPS : 
WE GIVE :

; STAMPS •: 
: WE GIVE :

STAMPS
_.r'

STAMPS 

W i GIVE

STAMPS

Y O U ’L L  L IK E  U S

WELCOME
Our Store Manager

VIVIAN HELMS
And Her Staff Wglcome You To This Fine 

Complete Gift Store

HOURS 10:00-5:00 TUES-SAT

Circle W 
Blue Stamps

To Fill A Book
GIFTS FOR ALL THE 

FAMILY
From The Usual

To The Unusual
m

Few Ladies Boots 
ODDS & ENDS

T

BANKAMERICARD WESTERN 
GIFT STORE

220 W. SNYDER ROTAN 735-3176
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I  3 0 0  S H E E T
3 A F F IL IA T E D

N O T E  B O O K

PAPER

$1.19
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3 0 0  C O U N T  

C O S M E T I C  
C O T T O N

PUFFS

59t
C O N T A D IN A

3 0 0

TOMATOES

3/$1
M J B 100  C O U N T

TEA
BAG

$1.29
A L W A Y S  F R E S H

BREAD

2/790
S H U R F R E S H  

Va G A L L O N

BUTTERMILK

790
T E R L IN G U A

B L A C K E Y E D

PEAS
W IT H

J A L A P E N O S

4/$1

WE GIVE

STAMPS

SLICED QUARTER LOIN 
9-11 CHOPS

Pork Chopsy^ iked Hams

h il l s h ir e  f a r m  s m o k e d

POUSH SAUSAGE
l e a n  COUNTRY

STYLE SPARE RIBS
OSCAR MAYER FRESH PORK

l in k  SAUSAGE
OSCAR MAYER WIENERS OR

BEEF FRANKS
OSCAR MAYER SMOKIE

LINK SAUSAGE
OSCAR MAYER

I iT T i E SMOKIES

WILSON'S SMOKED CENTER CUTS

PORK 
CHOPS

WRIGHT'S HICKORY 
DRY SHANK PORTION

LB.

$ 1 6 9  Ir a R kI CHOPS

LB.
LEAN CENTER CUT RIB

$ 1 4 9
LB.

WRIGHT'S HICKORY SMOKED SLAB

SLICED 
BACON

LEAN CENTER CUT LOIN

PORK
CHOPS

$ 1 5 9

' f ..-

REGULAR OR SUPER

KOTEX NAPKINS /So?
LONG GRAIN «  a  _

COMET RICE 69^
T  E  R  L I  N G U  A  .  WITH JALAPENOS — c  ■  A A

PINTOS 4 / nsM®®

GOLD MEDAL (PAPER BAGS) C W M O O

 ̂ r  ’  ENRICHED FLOUR ^2 ^
MAXWELL HOUSE

GROUND COFFEE 1 LB.
c a l ;

$A39
FROZEN FOOD CASE BUYS

MINUTE MAID FROZEN

ORANGE JUICE
SHURFINE FROZEN

12 0Z. 
CAN 5 9 *

snuKriiMt rKuz.cw

BROCCOLI SPEARS pVo 3 9 *
r n r \ - r r K t  ^EEF ENCHILADAS-CHEESE ENCHILADAS/MEXICAN/rKU/bN FIESTA OR COMBINATION DINNERS ^

PATIO DINNERS cf;49*

WE HONOR 
FOOD COUPONS 
AT THRIFTWAY

KRAFT CHEESE LOAF

VELVEETA
9 9 *1 LB. 

LOAF

PILLSBURY BUHERMILK OR COUNTRY STYLE

BISCUITS
8 01. S r 0 0

’/2 GAL. 
CTN.*

SUPER SPRAY

SECRET DEODORANT

HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS
SKIN CARE CREAM

ROSE MILK
12 OZ. 

JAR
$139

NO. 950-2 PAK EVE READY SIZE D

BA U ERIES
NO. 1215.4 PAK EVEREADY SIZE AA HEAVY

BATTERIES
2 eor4 9 *

4 eor9 9 *

ALL PURPOSE

RUSSET
POTATOES

HUNTS 32  O Z

CATSUP
79 C

6 B O T T L E  
C A R T O N

DRPEPPER
$ 15 9 P l u s  D e p o s i t

PLAIN S W I F T S  1 5 1 /2  O Z

CHIU
VZ9 c

F O O D  K IN G  2 1 /2  E L B E R T A

PEACHES
^ 9 C

DOUBLE BLUE STAMPS GLEN’S Now Thru January 19th Visit Stamp Center 220 W. Snyder
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N o tic e
LEGAL NOTICE

Notice To Bidders of 
County’s Intentions to Let 
Contract for The Construc­
tion of Fisher County 
Courthouse Annex at Roby, 
Texas.

Sealed Proposals address­
ed to Dwight Lovett, County 
Judge, Fisher County, Tex­
as, will be received until 
10:00 a.m. on the 8th day of 
February 1.977, at the County 
Courhouse, for the construc­
tion of Fisher County 
Courthouse Annex at Roby, 
Texas.

Proposals will, at said 
time, be publicly opened and 
read aloud for furnishing all 
labor, materials, tools and 
equipment and performing 
all work, including the 
mechanical and electrical 
work, required for the 
completion of this project in 
accordance with the plans 
and specifications prepared 
by Lovett, Sellars, McSped- 
den and Gover, Architects, 
San Angelo, Texas.

Any bid received after the 
above fixed time of receiving 
bids will be returned un­
opened.

Bids must be submitted on 
the prescribed proposal form 
which is included in the 
Specifications for this pro- > 
ject. The Bidder must supply 
all the information required 
by such proposal form and 
comply with the require­
ments of the plans and 
specifications.

Bidders must submit with 
their bids a Cashier’s or 
Certified Check on a bank 
satisfactory to the Owner, 
payable to or endorsed, 
without recourse to Fisher 
County, Texas, in the 
amount of 5% of the 
maximum bid price, for 
submit a Proposal Bond in 
the same amount from a 
reliable Surety Company 
satisfactory to Fisher Coun­
ty, as a guarantee that the 
Bidder will enter into a 
contract and execute the 
required bonds within ten 
(10) days after notice of 
acceptance of his bid and the 
award of the Contract to him. 
Bids without Check or 
Proposal Bond will not be 
considered. The checks and 
proposal bonds of unsuccess­
ful bidders will be returned.

The successful bidder on 
the project will be required 
to furnish a Performance 
Bond and a Payment Bond, 
each in the full amount of the 
Contract, written by a 
responsible surety company 
to the Com missioners’ 
Court, as required by Article 
5160, V.A.T.C.S. Attention 
is directed to Article 5159a, 
V.A.T.C.S., which requires 
that not less than the general 
prevailing rates of per diem 
wages for work of a similar 
character in the locality 
where the work is performed 
shall be paid all laborers, 
workmen and mechancis 
employed in the construction 
of public works.

Two sets of plans and 
specifications may be obtain­
ed by bonafide prime 
bidders, upon deposit of 
$25.00 for each set, at the 
office of the Architect, 
Lovett, Sellars, McSpedden 
and Gober, 618 South Abe, 
San Angelo, Texas 76901. All 
deposits will be refunded 
upon the return of plans and 
specifications promptly and 
in good condition. Additional 
plans and specifications may 
be obtained upon payment of 
the cost of reproduction. No 
sets or partial sets will be 
issued to sub-bidders or 
materials suppliers.

Plans and ^specifications 
will be placed in appropriate 
plan rooms for the use of 
sub-contractors and material 
suppliers.

Bidders should carefully 
examine the plans, specifica­
tions and other documents, 
visit the site of the work and 
fully inform themselves as to 
all condtions and matters 
whcih can in any way affect 
the work or the costs thereof. 
Should a bidder find discrep­
ancies in, or omissions from, 
the plans', specifications or 
other documents, or should 
he be in doubt as to their 
meaning, he should at once 
notify * the Architect and 
obtain clarification prior to 
subm ii^g  any bid. No bid

may be withdrawn for at 
least thrity (30) days after 
the scheduled closing time 
for receipt of bids.

All prices must be stated 
in both script and figures. 
The County intends to enter 
into a Contract with the 
lowest responsible Bidder. 
The County reserves the 
right to reject any or all bids 
and to waive formalities. In 
case of ambiguity or lack of 
clearness in stating the price 
in the bids, the County 
reserves the right to consider 
the most advantageous con­
struction thereof, or to reject 
the bid.

The Contractor will be 
required to comply with the 
provisions of the Davis 
Bacon Act and should 
acquaint himself with these 
provisions before submitting 
a bid on this project. The 
Contractor must furnish the 
Certificate of Compliance 
with the Davis Bacon Act on 
the appropriate form with 
the Contract Documents.

Dwight Lovett 
County Judge 

for The Commissioners 
Court,

Fisher County, Texas 
4j-3tc

Coffee Given 
For Mrs. Warner

Mrs. Buck T. Hughs 
hosted a coffee December 
22, for her houseguest, Mrs. 
L.G. Warner. Guests were 
teachers and other personnel 
of the Roby Schools who had 
been associated with Mrs. 
Warner while she was a 
teacher in the schools.

Mrs. Oddis Brown assist­
ed with the refreshments. 
Others attending were 
Mmes. J.B. Hughey, Her­
bert McHaney, Dwight Lov­
ett, Wayne Pursley.

JAMIE WALKER WITH GRAND CHAMPION HOG

West Texas Girl 
Scout Meeting Set

The West Texas Girl Scout 
Council Annual Meeting will 
be held at Abilene Christian 
University on Monday, Jan. 
24, at 7 p.m. in the Main 
Dining Room of the Campus 
Center.

Mrs. J.B. Cooper, Jr., of 
Roscoe, Council President, 
will preside at the business 
meeting and the program 
will be presented by Girl 
Scouts who have participated 
in Wider Opportunities the 
past two summers. There 
will be a slide show 
presentation of the events 
and a display of scrapbooks, 
pictures and mementos. 
Mrs. Morgan Knapp, Abi­
lene, Program Services 
Chairman, will introduce 
each girl by the special 
opportunity attended: Beck 
Thatcher Beckons, Hanibal, 
Mo.; Dig Mankind, Ten- 
sleep, Wyoming; Earth ‘N 
Us, II, Bryn Wawr College, 
Penn.; Our Cabana, Cuerna­
vaca, Mexico; West Texas- 
Rockwood B icen ten n ia l 
Tour, Washington, D.C.;

and Climb and Canoe a Mile 
High, Denver, Colorado, 
Rocky Mountain National 
Park.

A slate of nominees for the 
board of directors and 
nominating committee will 
be presentd by Mrs. Jimmy 
Smith, Roscoe.

Voting delegates from 
Roby are Mrs. Roy Mize and 
Mrs. Jake Morgan, S.U. 
Chairman.

Special decorations will 
feature troop flags designed 
by over 200 of the council 
troops. Winning designs for 
the Camp Boothe Oaks 1977 
Silver Anniversary patch and 
a new Camp Boothe Oaks 
patch for 1978 will be 
awarded full camperships to 
summer camp, 1977.'

Special guests will be 
husbands, wives, friends and 
Senior Girl Scouts from all 
over the 16 counties of the 
West Texas Council.

Reservations ($4.00 per 
person) are due at the West 
Texas Girl Scout Council, 
P.O. Box 5586, Abilene, Tex. 
79605. on Januarv 17.

Hobbs HDC Has 
Monthly Meet

The Hobbs Home Demon­
stration Club met in the 
home of Mrs. Walter Byrd 
December 16 with the 
traditional Christmas tree 
and the exchange of gifts.

There was no order of 
business except handing out 
the new Year Book for 1977. 
Mrs. Bill Hardy read a 
Christmas Story and the 
group sang “ Silent Night” .

Mrs. Dale Cave and Mrs. 
Byrd passed out the gifts and 
secret pals were revealed. 
Names were drawn for 1977.

Mrs. Byrd invited all to a 
table laden with Christmas 
goodies and punch. She had 
handmade and painted fa­
vors for each one present.

Those attending were 
Mmes. James Nettleton, 
Dale Cave, Turner Hough­
ton, Clarence Anderson, J.P. 
Phillips, Bill Hardy, Fred 
Martinez, James Lay, and 
Connie Tutt.

The next meeting will be 
with Mrs. Clarence Ander­
son January 13, at 2:30 p.m.

Buzz Bugs 
Hold Meeting

The Buzz Bugs Club met 
Jan. 5 in the Rotan 
Community Center.

Games of 42 and dominoes 
and refreshments were en­
joyed by Lelia Nash, Mamie 
Crow, Lena Feagan, Gaynell 
Henry, Velma Wallace and 
Joe Henry.

The members meet on 
each Wednesday from 1:30 
until 4 p.m. and visitors are 
welcome.

Contem|>orary
Cards

Send a laugh today!
N E W S P A P E R  O F F IC E  

7 3 5 -2 5 6 2

A T a x  Com parison  
O f Real Property  

In H am lin  IDS Vs M cCaulley IDS
B elow  is  an exam p le  of the h igh er ta x e s  to be paid in H am lin  
Independent School D is tr ic t  b ased  on a $10, OOG. value of 
taxab le  p rop erty  in ea ch  d is tr ic t .

E xam ple: If a p rop erty  ow ner has a p a r c e l of taxab le  
p rop erty  va lu ed  at $10, 000. , a co m p a riso n  
of ta x e s  to be paid in each  d is tr ic t .

% Assessment of Total 
Taxable Value

Tax Rate Per 
$100 Value-

Total Taxes to be Pai< 
Per $1,000. Value

HAMLIN

McCAULLEY

85% $1.33 $113.50

60% $1.40 84.00

Note: A TAXPAYER WILL%AY 35% MORE TAXES

MARK YOUR BALLOT ®  AGAINST CONSOLIDATION

- o m m i  B m m ~
•B9leia0fid(d

w v  > ^ \ ( r | ^ f 3 < ^ L L o r

a FOR
A FAVOR DE

a g a in s t

CONTRA

Consolidation of McCaulley Independent School 
D istrict and Hamlin Independent School D istrict

Uniflcacion del D istrito Escolar Independiente de McCaulley 
de el D istrito Escolar Independiente de Hamlin

Each voter shall vote on the proposition hereby subm itted by placing an
*•

"X” in  the square  beside the statement indicating the way he w ishes to vote.

Cada votador votara en el asunto sometido por este medio cuando pone un

e l ouadro al lado de la deolaracion que indica el modo en que el qu iere v o ta r .

A dvertising  paid for by the M cC aulley Educational Council, M rs J, T. 
Jeffrey , Publicity Chairman

Roby Boxing Team 
Travels To Seminole

The Roby boxing team 
went to Seminole to a golden 
glove tournament last week­
end. Jay Lynn Helm, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Helm of 
Roby, won his match Friday 
night with Robert Chaney of 
Lubbock, then came back 
Saturday night and lost by a 
split decision to Junior 
Rodriquez of Rankin, for the 
championship. Helm also 
won the outstanding Pee 
Wee boxing award.

Stevey Rivas, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Rivas of Roby, 
lost his fight Friday night tc 
Terry Raines of Seminole.

Joe Carreon, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Roy Carreon, ost 
his fight Friday night to 
Ricky Rubio of Pecos.

James Terry, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bob Terry, lost his 
fight Friday night to Gilbert 
Costello of Lubbock.

Albert Castaneda, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Martin 
Castaneda, drew a bye 
Friday night and won the 
championship over Eddy 
Templeton of Rankin Satur­
day night.

Curtis Chapman, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Helm, 
also dreq a bye Friday night 
and came back Saturday 
night and lost by a split

decision to Wayne McKenzie 
of Rankin for the champion­
ship.

The team expressed their 
thanks to Leon Helm for the

$100.00 donation, it was 
greatly appreciated. Anyone 
interested in boxing can 
contact Johnny Claxton at 
776-2768 in Roby.

* We
Will
Be

Closed
To
Go
To

M arket
On

M onday  
Ja n u a ry  17th

White's Auto
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FINAL
DARDEN’S

DEPARTMENT STORE
Close, Monday, 

January 17th
4 rrl

m
Before Closing The Entire Stock Left Will Be |

Sold For Drastic 
REDUCTIONS I

o f f !
Children, Mens & Ladies Shoes. 

Some Red Wing Boots In Broken Sizes.

Blouses Lingerie
Some Mens & Boys Shirts 

Few Ladies Boots 
ODDS & ENDS

Darden’s
Department Store

Rotan, Texas
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Cherished Awards Given At Football Band Banquet
Rotan football players and 

band members held their 
annual Football-Band Ban­
quet last Saturday night at 
the Rotan cafeteria. The 
theme bj||the annual event 
was centered around a 
“ Wintfer In Hammerland“ as 
blue and white winter 
decorations accented the 
banquet. Mother Nature 
added her own realistic touch 
about .2 hours before the 
banquet as icy weather and 
snows moved through Rotan.

The night was filled with 
highlights as Head Coach 
Don Mullins presented 
awards to players and Band 
Director Kelly Glaze recog­
nized their achievements and 
awards.

The evening began with 
Mullins remembering Bill 
Gladson who recently passed 
away. ;He had been a 7-year 
volunteer that took movies of 
each season game. The 
players and band members 
stood as all observed a 
moment^ of silence for 
Gladson/

The first award of the 
night was presented to Paul 
Hinsq^i as he was named to 
receive ih e  defensive down 
lineman award. Donny Mul­
lins took the cornerback 
award, with John Cox taking 
the j^efensive secondary 
award^^d Ray Weathersbee 
capturifg the linebacker 
award^^'

Thel ^Back of the Year 
awardP^ent to John- -̂ Cox; 
Mullih'^said Cpx graded a 75 
for the^ear^^“ ,:£■

Robe^ Posey made the 
first of two trips to the head 
table td;pick tip awards as he 
was named the Linerhah of 
the Yen^ with a grade of 71. 
Posey was also tapped to get 
the “ Mbst Improved Player” 
award.-  ̂ He is only a 
sophOipore and aefehTdin  ̂ tO;? 
Mullipl will be a valuable 
asset the next two yearsi

In .^dition to John Cox 
getting the DefensivfiJSqgon^ 
dary and Back of the Year 
awards he was' named to 
receiv^ the coveted “ Ham­
mer Spirit Award” . '4

Wes Morrow and Jerry 
Carr Joined John Cox to 
make up the trio of team 
captaips for the 1976 season. 
This ' award is traditionally 
preserved at thq ;end of tfip 
seasof]̂ .

F o ^ a ll  players voted 
Patti Weathersbee as the 
footbafl sweetheart.

Band Director Glaze ex- 
presi^ed his appreciation to 
the ipajorettes, twirlers and 
senior: band members for 
theirjefforts during the first 
half of the 1976-77 year.

Judy Weatherman was 
named to receive the Most 
Improved Marching Yellow- 
hami^lr award.

Wes* Morrow, who ended 
the Reason with his leg and 
arm |i^ a cast, was voted by 
the band members as the 
FootiaJl Hero.

Band member Mary Lynn 
Crawford was named the 
Band Sweetheart.

Glaze honored the senior 
band members by introduc

ing each one and expressed 
his appreciation to Lee Scott 
Smith, Rotan Band Presi­
dent.

Donna Smith and Patti

Williams presented the sen­
ior cheerleaders, Cindy 
Springer, Patti Weathersbee 
and Jill Hill with gifts as the 
evening festivities drew to a 
close.

Horace Carters Make 
AFBF Honolulu Meeting

Mr. and Mrs. Horace 
Carter of Rotan along with 
445 Texas Farm Bureau 
members from 111 counties, 
including a number of state 
Farm Bureau officials and 
staff members left Dallas-Ft. 
Worth International Airport 
Thursday, Jan. 6, to Honolu­
lu for an 11 day trip to 
Hawaii that includes attend­
ing the 47th annual AFBF 
meeting January 9-12.

More than 12,000 persons 
from across the nation were 
expected to attend the 
annual meeting where main 
policy issues to be resolved 
included farm program, 
taxation, international trade. 
Federal regulations involv­
ing agriculture and Federal 
spending programs.

Texas Farm Bureau Presi­
dent Carrol Chaloupka leads 
the 14 voting delegates from

Texas. The other 13 in>:lude 
the entire board of directors. 
Alternates are three former 
board members whose terms 
expired last month.

Horace Carter, president 
of the Fisher County Farm

Roby Boys 
In District
The Roby Lions ran their 

district record to 4-0 last 
Friday as they downed the 
Hermleigh Cardinals 45-41. 
Brad Stuart canned 22 points 
in leading all scorers. Ricky 
King and Steve Evers pulled 
down 14 rebounds each.

Roby led all the way but 
turned the ball over too many 
times to pull too far ahead. 
The Lions shot 30 percent for 
the game and that is 10 
percent off their team

Bureau, has been appointed 
by Carrol Chaloupka Presi­
dent of Texas Farm Burear. 
to serve as one of seven 
members of the Texas Farm 
Bureau Cotton Advising 
Committee for 1977.

Stand 4-0 
Action

shooting percent average.
Earlier in the week the 

Lions defeated the Highland 
Hornets 61-41 at Highland. 
Brad Stuart tallied 22 points, 
followed by Ricky King’s 16 
points. Ricky Morton pulled 
down 16 rebounds and 
scored 10 points as the Lins 
dominated the game.

The Lions stand 14-6 on 
the season and 4-0 in District 
play. They Lions entertain 
Ira and Hobbs this week.

_  Belynda’s

I  Pen And Pad
M Roby, Texas 776-2P* ^

Well we really had a bad weekend, weatherwise, and all 
that sleet was sure dangerous. It got to 9 degrees here at the 
house and that’s pretty cold.

Not too many visitors this week as the weather was so bad, 
nobody wanted to get out in it.

Contratulations to Mr. and Mrs. Gary Finley on the birth 
of a new baby girl, born at Hamlin on Monday. Gary is the 
FFA teacher at Hobbs.

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew WilUams went to Lubbock Friday 
night and spent the night with Mr. and Mrs. Ricky Williams. 
They were on their way to Dalhart but decided not to go as 
the roads were so bad. They spent the night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Ricky Williams again Saturday and returned home 
Sunday, running into bad roads almost all the way home. 
They attended a basketball tournament at Crosbyton 
Saturday night and Mrs. Ricky Williams’ team won 1st place 
in the tournament. Louise’s brother is very bad and they 
have put him back in the hospital at Dalhart.

Mr. and Mrs. Windle Kincaid from Rotan ate Sunday 
dinner with Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Kincaid. Last Wednesday 

Tommy Hargrove from Iowa visited with the Kincaids. We 
were sorry to hear that Mrs. J.D. Kincaid’s sister, Mrs. 
Meloda Anderson is back in the Fisher County Hospital and 
we hope that she will soon be feeling lots better.

Mr. and Mrs. J.W . Etheredge attended the Fisher Co. 
Livestock Show on Saturday at Roby. Both Todd and David 
showed sheep. Also showing from Hobbs were Jeff Anderle, 
Jim Ratliff, Mike McGrew, Mark Anderle and Don Denman. 
A large number of Hobbs folks braved the cold weather and 
attended the stock show. Gary Finley was in charge of the 
Hobbs boys and their stock.

Well this is short this week, but maybe the weather will be 
warmer next week, and we’ll have more visitors. See you 
next Thursday.

Visiting in the Buck T. 
Hughs home during the 
Christmas Holidays were 
Mr. and Mrs. L.G. Warner, 
Mobile, Ala.; Mr. and Mrs. 
George Blakely, Phil and 
Diane, Plano; Becky and 
Renee Lee, Mr. and Mrs. 
Randy Wright, Levelland; 
Mr. and Mrs. Buck F. 
Hughs, Sweetwater; Mr. and 
Mrs. Stanley Nowlin, Mark 
and Dana, Rotan.
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Your personal envoy 
of good taste

N E W S P A P E R  O F F IC E  
7 3 5 -2 5 6 2

County Schools 
Lunch Menu

FOOTBALL-BAND BANQUET AT ROTAN

Jamiarv 1 " . 1977
Rotan

Monday; Seasoned White 
Beans W /H am , Mashed 
Potatoes. Tomato & Lettuce 
Salad, Cornbread. Butter, 
Iced Cake Squares, Milk.

Tuesday: Barbeque on
Bun, Blackeyed Peas. Oran­
ge Wedge. Buttered Rice. 
Cookies. Milk.

W (.' d n e s d a > : V' e g e t a h 1 e
Beel Soup, C'rakers. Grilled 
Cheese Sandwiches. Celery 
and Carrot Sticks, Peanut 
Butter C'ookies. Milk.

Ihursday: Corndog with 
Mustard, Pork Beans. Potato 
Chips, Orange Juice. Banana 
Pudding. Milk.

Friday; Pinto Beans. F ren­
ch Fries W, C atsup, Buttered 
Corn. Beet Pickles. Onion 
Rings. Cornbread. Butter, 
Fruit Jello, Milk.

Fisher County 
Hospital News
Patients admitted to Fish­

er County Hospital January 
4-10, 1977.

Sarah E. Parker, Peacock; 
Maudie Reaves, A.D. Tur­
ner, Suzanne Hudnall, W.T. 
Trimble, Meloda Anderson, 
H.C. McKinney, Bertha 
Johnson, Brian Goodwin, 
Gloria Smith, Linda Brown, 
William Howell, Rotan; Wil­
liam D. Ellington, Kathy 
Ellington, Snyder; Nedra 
Smith, Jayton; Cynthia 
Smith, Aspermont; Milton 
Brown, Seagoville.

W ant A 
Fam ily  P icture

contact the
N E W S P A P E R  O F F IC E ]  

R O T A N

-■t
I

P U B L IC  N O T IC E
■ Star .-Gas Company m accr'id ance
With Section 43 (a) of A rtic le  1446c \/.A T C S-, 
hereoy erver. notice of the Conip tr’ y -.'tant 
to  implemH! t a new schedule  ot ra'r-s t - r  
natura l gas service to be chargea to. die 
residentia l and com m ercia l consum ers :r; ‘ I'te

C ity -of.. oy-y

effective i . ■. ■, , 1 9 7 7 .
The ra te ■ sch e d u le ■ is expe..:ted to ’ urmsh 

a ' pe rcent increase in the Company's

gross revenues in the City '•t . 'tO T '.n ,

■ . A, S ta tem ent; of intent has been fiied  with 

the’ C ity  of A‘0 ‘j . n

and is ava ilable for inspection at the Com- 

pa.hy'sVusiness o ffice  located at'

: 3 e t  wa t  e r , T‘o t ftf ■

6Lone Stdf Gds Company

Need A Gift ? 
s e e  the

N E W S P A P E R  O F F I C E  
R O T A N

WATCH SERVICES  
F IR S T

BA PJST  CH U R CH  
Sunday

11:00 a.m.-7:00 p.m. 
Channel 2

INTRODUCING THE NEW EST IN 
COOKING BY THE ROTAN  
KINDERGARTEN CLASS ----------

^  *

l :
Jr*

H-t

j f .*

j f *
♦ I

♦ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

E n ch ilad as

F iv e  p ie c e s  of c h e e s e . F iv e  
ta m a le s , four ch ick en s . Cook  
in  pan fo r  4 m in u te s . Put it  on 
the tab le  and ea t it.

F e l ix  Y anez

T acos

P ep p er and to r t i l la s .  Cook it in 
the k itch en  on top of the s to v e . 
Cook about 3 h ou rs. Then yovi 
g ive  them  to peop le  to ea t them  
a ll  up. C h ris C onalson

4-¥ ¥ ¥■ ¥ * ¥ * if 4-4-* ¥ ¥ * ¥

HATAHOE

I-k

i*

♦ ^

I-k
I-K

FUL-LINE SPECIA LS
Top N a tio n a l B ra n d s , Low  P r ic e d

Heavy Duty E-3000

DELCO
Battery O I

O ffer good thru Saturday, Jan. 29, 1977  
* Prices may vary among AC-Delco outlets.

T M O N R O E T

SHOCKS
BUY 3...Cet4th FREE!

RAIN
CHECK

Your
FUL-LINE ASSOCIATE 

has in-stock 
ava ilab ility of part 

numbers for most cars 
and trucks, or pick up 

a "Rain Check" 
during this special sale.

For a smooth, safe ride —  and 
SPECIAL SAVINGS —  BUY NOW.

MONROE GRIPPER
Full one-inch piston bore.

3 at
25ea.

Offer good thru Saturday, Jon. 29, 1977

4th
FREE

S U P ER  5 0 0 !
EXTRA HEAVY-DUTY^

vMONROÊ
SALE PRICES AT ANY OF
THESE PARTICIPATING BULL PARTS FUL-LINE ASSOCIATES:

CITY 4UT0 SUPPLY
ROTAN, TEXAS

mmcE
Get top dollar discount now 
thru February 28, during 
John Deere’s  Preseason Round- 
up of Haymaking Bargains
We’ll pay you to order hay and forage 
machines now... before we both get 
into the rush of haying season. To 
encourage pre-season ordering, you 
get top dollar discounts now through 
February 28 on machines listed 
below. So act fast and earn the extra 
cash discount for acting early... from 
$195to $2,600 depending on the 
machines you want.

DISCOUNT DISCOUNT
UNTIL 1 MAR. 1977-

MACHINES 28 FEB. 1977 30 APR. 1977
336 and 346 Balers; 
ISAand 16A Choppers;
100 Stack Mover; 25 and 
34 Forage Harvesters

$195 $90

1207,1209, and 1214 
Mower/Conditioners;
800 and 830 Wind rowers;
466 Baler; Round Balers;
35 and 3800 Forage Harvesters

$390 $195

100 Stack Wagon $520 $260
200 and 300 Stack Movers $650 $325
Hydrostatic Windrowers; 
200 and 300 Stack Wagons

$1,040 $520

Self-Propelled Forage 
Harvesters

$1,950 $975

230 Stack Shredder/ 
Feeder

$2,600 $2,600

No finance charges imposed until the next use season. Ask us for 
details. If dealer inventory of any product listed above is exhausted, it 
can be ordered.

^ 3  Farm Tractor &
735-2462 Service, Inc. 411 S. Cleveland
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Hustlin' Round Hoblis
By Mrs J im m y  W a lk e r  

H obbs, T e x a s  7 3 5 - 2 8 4 0

Looks like we may be in for some bad weather. Hope no 
one had any serious accidents on this slick ice.

Carl Martin is recovering at home after several days in the 
Fisher Co. Hospital. Jeff Simmons is still in Hendrick 
Hospital, Abilene, recovering from surgery he had last week. 
Ellen Hataway is home from Hendrick Hospital recuperating 
from recent surgery. Mrs. Glenda Fields has returned home 
after several days in Stamford Hospital. She is expected to 
return to work shortly. I hope all of these people continue to 
improve.

The Livestock Show held at the Roby Fair Grounds last 
Saturday attracted a tremendous crowd. There were several 
animals entered in each division and all the bovs and girls 
that participated did a good job of showing their animals.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Dennis, Julie and Brady of Cisco, Larry 
Dennis, DeAnn, Toby and Stacy of Rule visited with Mrs. 
Eva NeU Dennis over the weekend. Roy and family also 
visited in the home of the Tommie Jack Stuarts Saturday 
night.

Louise Keisling of Wall has been staying with the Albert 
Hataway family helping out while Ellen was in the hospital. 
She returned home Saturday before the bad weather got 
here.

Mrs. Clyde Farrar, Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Gann, Randy and
Dee Dee have recently returned from a week’s visit to 
Arizona and California. In Yuma they visited with Mike and 
Ronda Foster, then to Long Beach to visit Benny Hull and 
family and Betty McDaniels and family. Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronald Gann and family had dinner one day with Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Jarnigan and family.

Visiting recently in the Roy Herron home were Mrs. M.E. 
Herron, Mr. and Mrs. Don Rollins of Carlsbad, N.M., Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Hatchett and Christina, and Mr. and Mrs. 
D.A. Wilson and Jay all of Lubbock.

“To get maximum attention; its hard to beat a good, big 
mistake” .

Mr.and Mrs. Gary Graham and family had visiting with 
them during the holidays their daughters Laura of Los 
Angeles and Charlotte of PlayaDe Rey, Calif. Another 
daughter, Mark and Pam Knickerbocker and a friend Robert 
Armond of Arcadia, Calif, are visiting this week.

Congratulations to the Roby boys and girls basketball 
teams for their win over Hermleigh last Friday night.

Mr. Irving [Red] Parker is recovering at home after 
recently being in the Fisher County Hospital.

Visiting recently in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Waddell were Dr. and Mrs. Fred Waddell of Beaumont, 
Franklin Waddell and sons of College Station, Don Waddell 
of Bartlett, Kerri and Allen; Mr. and Mrs. Frank Rousseau 
and daughters of Irving; Vera Hopper of Ft. Worth; Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy John Waddell and Terry of Anson; John Waddell 
of Rotan and Margaret Bailey of Abilene.

Happy Birthday Wishes go to: Vanessa Hardwick Jan. 13, 
Debbie Stuart, Allan Goforth, LaVelle Terry and twin sister 
of Irving, LaNell Chandler, Jan. 14, Carmen Carreon Jan. 15, 
Dixie Whitfield, Chad Ballenger, Mrs. Willa McWhirter, 
Jan. 16.

Mr. and Mrs. George Goforth of Garland visited relatives 
in Roby and Hamlin over the weekend.

“ Nothing in life is to be feared. It is only to be 
understood” .

Drive careful over these icy highways. God Bless you, see 
you next week. _ _ _

Leisure Lodge
All residents up here are 

doing fine, some have had 
colds but all seem to be 
feeling fine now.

I want to apologize to the 
Kelly Lewises. I failed to 
report their Christmas 
guests. They were their 
daughter and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Noles, 
Deborah, Brenda and Bever­
ly of Gatesville, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Lewis Earl Madden of 
Hamlin.

Our bingo winner last 
week was Mrs. Etta Hale.

We had some good domino 
games last week. Slick 
Johnson was the biggest 
winner in dominoes.

Our sympathy to the 
family to Mary Brown, also, 
the family of Pearl Vernon.

The Geo. McBeths out of 
town company was Mr. 
Ernest Webb of McCaulley, 
Mrs. Elsie Newland of Ft. 
Worth, Mrs. Robert Martin

News
B y Im'a Berry

of Roby, Mr. and Mrs. 
Carlos McBeth of Snyder, 
Mr. and Mrs. Emmet Hicks 
of McCaulley and Mrs. 
Curtis Scifers of Hamlin.

This is all our news for this 
week, see you next week.

Weather
From the Recordnof 

FREDBYERLY
Rotan Weather Obseiver

Jan.77 Free. Hi Lo
Tue 4 65 34
Wed 5 32 27
Thur 6 59 22
F ri7 ' 60 24
Sat 8 44 25
Sun 9 .20 20 7
MonlO 40 7
Total .20

Total precipitation to date:
Est. Sleet and Snow.
1976 ....................
1977 ...................

Funeral Service
Clyde McKimmey

Clyde McKimmey, 87, 
long time Fisher County 
resident, died at 7:30 a.m. 
Tuesday, Jan. 11, in Fisher 
County Hospital. Services 
were held at 2 p.m. 
Wednesday in First Baptist 
Church, Rotan.

The Rev. Fred Thomas, 
pastor, officiated. Burial was 
in Rotan Cemetery directed 
by Weathersbee Funeral 
Home.

Born Jan. 29, 1889 in 
Hamilton County, he moved 
to Fisher County in 1912. He 
married Gara Gabel July 24, 
1926 in Rotan. She died April 
12, 1976. He was a Baptist

and served with the 36th 
Division in France and 
Germany in World War I. 
Survivors include 4 sons, 
Murl, Austin, Joe, and B.B., 
all of Rotan; 2 brothers, Jim 
McKinney of Carlton and 
Jack McKinney of Kerrville; 
3 sisters, Mrs. M.P. McGrew 
and Mrs. Dewey Dry both of 
Rotan, and Mrs. Emily Lane 
of Stamford; 5 grandchil­
dren; 4 step-grandchildren; 4 
great-grandchildren; and 4 
step-great-grandchildren.

He was preceded in death 
by a son, Scott, in 1949, 4 
brothers and 2 sisters.

New Cancer 
Weapon Available

A new “ weapon” against 
cancer is now available in 
Fisher County to provide the 
public with current, factual 
information on cancer, its 
prevention and early detec­
tion.

Called the Cancer Infor­
mation Service, the new 
program utilizes a toll-free 
phone line (1-800-392-2040) 
to answer public inquiries on 
cancer. The service will be 
extended to all residents of 
Texas by late this year.

The CIS is part of a public 
educational effort sponsored 
by The University of Texas 
M.D. Anderson Hospital and 
Tumor Institute with assist­
ance from the American Red 
Cross, American Cancer 
Society and many other 
health agencies in Texas 
which provide services to 
cancer patients and their 
families.

Funded by the National 
Cancer Institute, the CIS 
functions as part of a 
nation-wide network.

Open from 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
on weekdays, the phone lines 
are operated by trained 
American Red Cross volun­
teers. All background ma­
terial used to answer ques­
tions is reviewed by physic­
ians to insure accuracy.

The program is designed 
to help create a positive 
sense of awareness about 
cancer that will encourage 
the public to seek physician 
evaluation for early detection 
and prompt treatment of 
suspected cancers.

“ Im portant diagnostic, 
treatment, rehabilitation and 
research developments are 
occuring more frequently 
now. If people could over­
come their fear of cancer 
many more people would 
seek medical help at an 
earlier stage-when the rate 
of successful treatment is 
much greater,” said Dr. R. 
Lee Clark, president of M.D. 
Anderson.

In addition to answering 
questions on the telephone, 
the CIS staff mails many 
pamphlets published by 
health organizations, profes­
sional societies and govern­

ment agencies involved in 
health education.

Information not readily 
available from existing files 
can be obtained by the staff 
from an advisory panel of 
over 75 clinicians and other 
qualified sources outside 
Houston.

“ Because the CIS is based 
at M.D. Anderson and is part 
of a national communications 
network, we have easy 
access to information on 
important work being done 
at many other cancer 
centers,” explained Dr. 
Clark.

Missionaiy To 
Speak At Two 
Area Churches
Southern Baptist Mission­

ary, Tom McMillian, mis­
sionary to Tanzania East 
Africa, will be speaking 
Sunday at the Cross Roads 
Baptist Church and at the 
First Baptist Church of 
Rotan. He will be with the 
Cross Roads Church during 
the Sunday School hour 
Sunday morning and will 
speak at the 11:00 a.m. 
worship hour service. Sun­
day evening he will be with 
the First Baptist Church and 
will meet with the G.A.s and 
R.A.s at 6:00 p.m. and then 
speak to the church at the 
evening worship hour at 7:00 
p.m.

The G.A.s and R.A.s will 
have a “ hot-dog supper” at 
5:00 p.m. Sunday in Fellow­
ship Hall of First Baptist and 
at 6:00 p.m.. Missionary 
McMillan will speak to both 
groups in the church audi­
torium.

Following the evening 
worship service at the First 
Baptist Church, a film will be 
shown about the work being 
done in East Africa by the 
missionaries of the Southern 
Baptist Convention. The film 
will be shown at 8:00 p.m.

The public is invited to 
share in these services at 
both of these Rotan Church­
es.

A successful 

comeback story

Lions Country
 ̂ Coach Holik

The Lionesses are now 3-1 
in district action and they 
face two strong opponents 
this week. Tuesday we play a 
tough Ira squad. Ira has lost 
2 games in district, one game 
by 2 points to Hobbs, the 
other by 1 point to Loraine. 
So Ira will be a tough team to 
defeat. The Ira squad is led 
by All-District forward Rhon­
da Corbell and they have a 
tall post girl. The outcome 
will depend largely on our 
offense and how many points 
we score.

On Friday we face a tough 
rival in Hobbs. Hobbs has 
probably the most height of 
any team in the district. 
Hobbs has only lost 1 game 
and that was to Loraine by 1 
point. We will have to shut off 
the Gober girl and score 
strong to take this game.

Our forwards are getting 
stronger with each game and 
we are capable of scoring 60 
to 70 points per game. The 
forwards seeing most of the 
action are Cheryl Terry, 
Cindy King, Susan Matthies 

—
I W A N T E D  I
I T V  V ie w e rs  Sunday "
I 11:00 a.m. St 7:00 p.m.j 
I Channel 2 1
I F irst  Bap tist  C h u rch  »
I Rotan i

and Penny Coker.
Defensively, we are still 

doing a strong job. Our 
opponents are averaging 
only 40.6 points per game. 
Defensively we are led by 
Rhonda Welch, Tina Horton, 
Kim Faught, Lois Ann 
Cauble and Donna Hataway.

Once upon a time ... Perhaps that’s the 
way this story should begin because it’s 
that kind of story. Besides, as I’ve said 
before, I’ve always been a sentimental 
slob who likes it when the good guy wins 
out despite trials and tribulations.

The story I’d like to tell you today has 
all that — trials and tribulations followed 
by success over such elements. It’s got 
one of those corny themes about the good 
guy overcoming handicaps to become a 
success. The only uncorny thing about this 
one is that it’s true.

This is a success story. I suppose by 
some standards, this is a run-of-the-mill 
success story. However, I believe it has a 
message for youngsters who compete in 
athletics. If it provides inspiration for just 
one, it will have been worthwhile.

First, let’s preface the story. This is 
about a coach. Coaching high school 
football in Texas has to be one of the most 
frustrating, demanding and pressurized 
jobs there is. But it has its rewards. It 
takes, I believe, a certain type of in­
dividual to handle such a task. He has to 
be knowledgeable in the game, have an 
endless energy supply tank, be a working 
psych iatrist without the doctor’s 
remuneration, be a 24-hour model for his 
players, a father confessor, babysitter, 
doctor, a Christian, a tolerable speaker, 
have a low boiling point for irate fans and 
parents and have an understanding wife 
and family. The guy has to be darned near 
perfect because he touches and directs so 
many young lives.

To be successful he has to wear all the 
hats of the above mentioned professions, 
have luck on his side, a great love for the 
task, patience, a strong constitution to 
take heartbreaks, and a group of 
youngsters willing to sacrifice, to have the 
desire to excel and some talent.

Without youngsters like this, the guy 
might as well pack his bags and try 
another line of work.

This guy’s success story began on a day 
that almost finished his career in sports.

Back in the late summer of 1951, just 
when his athletic talents were beginning 
to blossom as an eighth grader, he was 
struck down by polio, the most dreaded 
disease of that era and before Salk vac­
cine.

But his case was discovered in its-early 
stages. He spent two months in the polio 
ward of an Abilene hospital.

His left side was left partially paralyzed 
and the bones weakened from the disease. 
Therein lies the second blow by fate. His 
love of athletics handed him another 
setback. Playing touch football against 
orders, he broke his left arm. The bones 
were so weakened they wouldn’t heal by 
themselves so a steel plate was placed on 
the big bone and the smaller bone was

held together by screws.
During the next two years he had that 

left arm in a cast 22 months.
He broke it a second time, then a third. 

The third break happened in baseball. By 
this time the arm had healed so strongly 
around the steel plate, you couldn’t have 
broken it with a hammer. Instead there 
was a compound fracture of the wrist. .

Still he was undaunted. While his 
teammates played football, he went to 
basketball, working solo in the gym with 
one arm. By the time basketball season 
rolled around he was so proficient with the 
one hand, teammates often couldn’t 
handle his passes. He played his first 
basketball game with a specially made 
steel cast encasing the left arm from 
elbow to wrist. It soon became as much a 
part of his attire as his pants.

In lieu of football, classmates urged him 
to become head cheerleader his freshman 
and sophomore years. He disliked it but 
felt the need to be a part of the team. He 
was overheard more than once in his sleep 
yelling, “ Give that guy some help out 
there.”

He did compete his junior and senior 
years in football, basketball, boxing, 
track and baseball, making all-district in 
football and baseball.

The steel cast served him well. He 
followed up high school with four years of 
college football without another break, 
then went into coaching.

His father died when he was 8, but that, 
too, played a role in his life. It helped him 
understand those kids he coaches who are 
fatherless. It made him mature faster and 
learn faster.

These brushes with fate had an impact 
on his life. He learned to live with pain and 
disappointment. He also learned that 
giving up when there still is something left 
isn’t the thing to do.

These traits he carried into cpaching. 
Apparently he has instilled theSe same 
traits in his young warriors. Saturday 
night in Waco he and his team will be 
playing for the Class A Texas State 
football championship.

If they win, it will be the second con­
secutive state title. They weren’t ex­
pected to win district this year after 
graduation losses left them with only six 
returnees. His record entering the state 
championship game tomorrow night is 45- 
7 for the past four years. With good 
groundwork laid, there may be more of 
the same coming in the next couple of 
years.

If all this sounds a wee bit prejudiced, 
or even wholeheartedly prejudiced, it’s 
because it is. I’m popping a few buttons 
lately, and all of it is not because I’m fat.

The guy is my younger brother, Jack 
Waggoner, head coach at DeI.«on.

An O pen Letter

To The R esidents O f The M cC au lley  ISD
Y our sc h o o l boardi a d m in is tra tio n , fa cu lty , high sc h o o l stu d en ts; and o th er  
e m p lo y e e s  want to go on r e c o r d  a s  OPPOSING the CO NSOLIDATIONbf the  
M cC au lley  ISD w ith the H am lin  ISD. A lthough  we r e c o g n iz e  the r ig h ts  and  
p r iv ile d g e s  of th o se  who do not ap p rove of the continu ed  o p era tio n  of the 
M cC au lley  S ch oo l, we f e e l  the ad van tages of having the sc h o o l for  your  
ch ild ren  outnum ber any p ro p o sed  d isa d v a n ta g es .
We stand rea d y , w illin g , and proud to  ju s tify  what we tea c h , what m on ey  we 
spend , what fu ture p lan s we have fo r  the sc h o o l, or any o th er  a r e a  that you  
m ay want to  know m o re  about b efo re  you vote  on the p r o p o sed  c o n so lid a tio n . 
We r e sp e c tfu lly  urge you to  GET THE FA C T S b efo re  you m ake a d e c is io n  
on th is  i s s u e .  It w ill c e r ta in ly  a f fe c t  you and your com m u n ity  in the y e a r s  
to c o m e . Thank you.

9
sen d  a 

c a r d  t h a t
SAYS . 

"I LOVE

DAY
MONDAY, FEBURDAY 14,1977

Having A Valentine Party?
The NEWSPAPER OFFICE Has Vdtent ine  

cups,  napkins ,  plates ,  centerpices  
& wal l  decorat ion.

We Have Boxed  
Valent ine  

Ca rds  Tool NEWSPAPER 
OFFICE

735-256  ̂ Rotan

M arion  R eed Kathy M cD onald A le x  E s c a m illa
E . T. G ibson D ycie  K em p F ern an d o  R om ero
K enneth V anD em an Sarah  S tev en so n M ich a e l V inson
Ju liu s D eck er N orm a S an d ers Todd S tev en so n
C e c il W illia m s J a m ie  B e ll Fonda J e ffr e y
B illy  W. J e ffr e y F ran k  K ern s Joe Spaulding
J e r ry  J e ffr e y R u s s e l l  P ippin R o sie  B en a v id es
D oyle B e ll E a r l W illia m s M ax K em p
G eneva C a rter L o lita  P e r a le s C lin t W heat
Z enob ia  C u rren t W ilm a W illia m s T racy  D ow ell
F aym a  D rum m ond C arla  Young J a m es K em p
Edd. R. F a r m e r B onnie P ipp in J a m es  J e ffr e y
H arlen e  F a r m e r J o N e ll C olem an D ebbie D eck er
W illard  E . F ran k lin S h ie la  J e ffr e y B r itt  J e ffr e y
Edna H ill C h erie  M cK inney C h erie  N o etzo ld
B obbie K irby A r le n e  C olem an M ike W ilk erson
B arb ara  M artin Janet C a ssa d y D eborah  Story
P au lin e  M o r r is Kathy P ippin W andell W illia m s
Sue Sm ith D onald N oetzo ld S ta c ie  V anD em an
D onald Story Bobby B en a v id es R ita  W ilk erson
Sue Story Kathy W ilk erson Todd J e ffr e y
Joe B en a v id es D en n isa  D eck er T am i J e ffr e y  

D arren  J e ffr e y  
John E s c a m illa

Mark Your Ballot Against The Consolidation 

On Saturday, January 15,1977
A d v e r tis in g  paid  fo r  by the M cC au lley  E d u cation a l C ou n cil, 

M rs J. T. J e ffr e y , P u b lic ity  C hairm an

r.-

1̂ :

f i
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Rotan HDC Club 
Holds Meeting

The Rotan Home Demon­
stration Club met January 6, 
with Mrs. Ben Hargrove. 
Mrs. Oral Sparks, the club 
president had charge of the • 
business meeting. Mrs. 
Hargrove, the secretary and 
treasurer, read the minutes 
of the last meeting. Mrs. 
Barney Bigham gave the 
Council report.

-Mr. Gayle Morgeson of 
Roby was to give the
program “ First Aid Demon­
stration” . but was unable to 
attend. The members discus­
sed different ways to make 
the Club a better one for * 
1977. The roll call was
answered by “ What Is 
Happiness?” .

A delicious refreshment* 
plate was served to two
visitors. Mrs. Ray Ashton 
and Mrs. Joe Little, and 
members present. Mrs. 
Viola Hendon. Mary and
Lpuada Posey. Rosa Horton. 
Mines. J.O. Hudnall. H.E. 
Aldridge. V.B. Murphree. 
Herman Wallace. J.W. Por­
ter. J.M. Long and Mrs. 
Komie Kersh.

The next meeting. January 
20. will be with Mrs. J.O. 
Hudnall at 2;.W p.m. County 
Home Demonstrator. Mrs. 
Donald Ballenger. will give a 
program on “ Slow Cookery” 
Visitors arc always welcome.

Longworth HDC Holds Meeting Sul Ross State Registration
Longworth Home Demon­

stration Club met in the 
home of Mrs. H.F. Guelker 
Jan. 3. The program on 
“ First Aid" was given by 
Mr. Gayle Morgeson. He 
showed a film and explained 
how to give artificial respira­
tion and to restore breathing.

He said to act quickly and 
waste no time in placing the 
person on his back, lifting 
neck, and tilting head, 
remove food or objects from 
mouth. Pinch nose closed, 
make airtight seal around 
victim’s mouth with your 
mouth and forcefully breathe 
into victim until chest rises 
(expands), continue breath­
ing for victim 12 times per 
minute without stopping. If 
chest doesn’t rise, roll victim 
onto side and pound firmly 
between shoulder blades. 
Have someone call the doctor. 
immedialcK .

In case ot cuts, wrap v\ith 
clean cloth, ’mdd cut part 
high and press firi.ilv on cut 
to st»ip tlou ol blood until 
getting to doctor oi- b.e.spual.

lo llou ing  the pro.gram, 
retreshmems of saudv. ichos. 
chips, mullms. ae.d cc.lfct. 
u(.re se r \cd  ihcu iIk ' 
meeting M'nimued.

The hoiiso was ..ailed, to 
order, minules read and roll 
called.

The programs were ar­
ranged for several months 
and the meeting adjourned.

Next meeting will be in the 
home of Mrs. Roy Scherwitz 
on Jan. 17. The County 
Extension Agent will give 
the program on slow cook­
ery.

Registration opened Janu­
ary 10 for extension courses 
to be offered by Sul Ross 
State University at Western 
Texas College. Students may 
register January 10 through 
January 14 during regualr 
office hours in the adminis­
tration building of WTC.

Classes are to begin

Beta Sigma Phi To Help Defray 
Medical Bills

Beta Sigma Phi City 
Council of Abilene area will 
hold a benefit tasting tea 
Saturday, Jan. 15, to help 
defray expenses incurred by 
Mr. and Mrs. E.A. Click, 
whose baby Donea died of 
tubercular meningitis May- 
18. 1976.

Tea hours will be from 11 
a.m. , to 5 p.m. at the 
Episcopal Church ot Heaven­
ly Rest, at 602 Meander in 
Abilene.

Recipes of the dishes to be 
served are compiled into a 
cookbook in honor of Donea 
and are available at $2.00. 
The tea itself will be $1.50 
and w hole pies and cakes will 
be available.

The Natalie Powers show 
on Thursday. Jan. 13, will

feature Beta Sigma Phi 
representatives who will tell 
about the tea and Donea’s 
story.

Donea was the granddau­

ghter of Mr. and Mrs.Carroll 
Murphree, and great-grand­
daughter of Mrs. V.B. 
Murphree and Mrs. B.A. 
Knight, all of Rotan.

Methodists To 
Observe Week 
Of Prayer Soon

The ladies of the First 
United Methodist Church of 
Rotan will have a special 
week of prayer for the 
Nation, Sunday, Jan. 16, at 
4:00 p.m. in the sanctuary of 
the church.

All ladies in the communi­
ty are invited to attend.

January 17, with the semes­
ter closing May 12. Classes 
meet once each week from 
6:30-9:30 p.m. at Western 
Texas College.

Seven courses are schedul­
ed for the spring semester. 
They are: Ed. 5307-Graduate 
Research; Ed. 5313-Voca­
tional Guidance; Ed. 6307- 
School Public Relations; Ed. 
6308-Advanced Studies in 
Child Growth and Develop-, 
merit; Ed. 7309-State and 
Federal Programs in the 
Public Schools; His. 5310- 
Seminar in American His­
tory; Soc. 5303; Multicultural 
Systems.

Tuition is $68 for three 
semester hours and $86 for 
six hours. This represents 
the total cost excluding 
textbooks.

The Veterans Administra­
tion reports there are 87,000 
women veterans with service 
in the Air Force since World 
War II.

Terry Leads 
In Highland

The Roby High School 
girls traveled to Highland 
last Tuesday night and 
defeated them by the score 
of 54-34. Leading the scoring 
for Roby was Cheryl Terry

Roby
Win

Mr. and Mrs. Michael 
Castles of Iowa Park announ­
ce the arrival of their son, 
Joshua on December 30. He 
weighed 8 lbs. 5 ozs. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Barnes of 
Wichita Falls and Mrs. Lewis 
Castles. Great-grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Barnes of Roby and great- 
aunt and uncle are Mr. and 
Mrs. Parker Wetsel of Roby.

B efore  You P u rc h a s e  A New C ar  
Or P ick . . .G iv e  U s  A C h a n ce  To  
Sh o w  You How Much Y o u ’ll 

S a v  e At
F & M Chevrolet-Buick

Com plete  S a le s  & S e rv ic e  
7 3 5 - 2 2 4 4

105 S  C le v e la n d Rotan, T e x a s

with 23 points, followed by- 
Cindy King with 21 points, 
Lois Ann Cauble and Sylvia 
Gaona.
Susan Matthies with 6 
points, and Penny Coker 4 
points.

Defensively the Lionesses 
were led by Kim Faught, 
Rhonda Welch, Tina Horton.

The rubella vaccine can 
spare the unborn severe, 
sometimes fatal birth defects 
reports the March of Dimes. 
In less Than six years, the 
number of infants born 
damaged by congenital ru­
bella has been reduced by 70 
per cent.

M LV IN  
CROW

R E P R E S E N T I N G  
T H E

Reliable 
Insurance Co.

Life & Fire 

735-2995

R O T A N ,  T E X A S
SSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSS^

4 8

PREFINiSHED

PANELiNG

P e r  S h e e t

Green Peg 
Glacier ^ 8 . 4 0

N <' w

*7.59
F r o s t y  

Elm $ 7 . 9 7
N c vv *7.19

Mastercraft 

Deerfield 

Pecan Reg

 ̂ <7.95
1 ■’/2 X 6 0  yd

Dust Tape
Per Roll

$4.25
N o w  $ 3 , 8 9

Home 735-3565

Rockwell
Bros. & Co.
“ Lum berm en”

735-2431
Rotan, Texa s

Picture Frames
We’ll help you select just 

the right color and style 
frame for your favorite 
picture.

We have a large selection 
of frames. We also have 
non-glare glass to accent 
your favorite photo.

Your satisfaction is guar­
anteed when you visit

Landes Furniture
For Picture Frames 

735-3171

wantJ iI I I
ADS 

GET
RESULTS

C L A S S m E D ^
Classified Advertising cost is 5 cents per word, $1.00 minimum. Cards of Thanks are $1.00 minimum 

up to 40 words, 5 cents per word thereafter. Name, not phone numbe, must be given on all charge 
classified advertising and full payment is due upon publication of advertising.

QUICK...

AS
A RABBIT

Color

Photography
By Kim Pease 

Weddings 
Family Reunions 
and Gatherings 
Family Pictures 

See Samples 
at

NEWSPAPER OFFICE 
735-2562

sv~..0$y ■
Farm & Ranch

Loans

Through The 
FEDERAL LAND BANK 

fi ASSOCIATION OF ROBY

E-J. Richardson, Jr.
Manager ®

91'5-776-2321

FOR SALE
Located at 6th and Tyler, 

six room house,, asbestos 
siding, completely refinish­
ed. Call Juston Morrow, 
735-3254. 51-tfc

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY

FOR SALE;  ̂ I-ots 
150x83 ft. on highway 180 
and College in Roby. One 
block from city square, 
commercial property, has 
house and several old 
buildings on lot. Call 
915-694-0430, or write Dave 
R. Weeks, 4603 Leisure 
Midland, Texas 79701. 9-tfc

FRAME THAT PICTURE: If
you’re looking for an inexpens­
ive picture frame, look no 
further than Marie’s Art Studio. 
Hundreds of frames, precut 
from small 5x7 to large 30x40 in 
stock. Frames from 3 to 6 inches 
thick in oak, gold leaf, and pine. 
Shop around before you buy. 
Marie’s Art Studio, West 
Snyder Avenue, Rotan. 21-tfc

FOR SALE: Keshawn
puppy for sale, call 776-2306 
or see at Farmers Gin in 
Rotan during day. Buster 
Palmer. 42-tfc

NOTICE; Start decompos­
ing your cotton burrs on 
contract with McClure’s Feed 
and Fertilizer, 776-2448, 
Roby. 45-3tc

FOR SALE: Good used 
appliances, refrigerators, 
washers, freezers, etc. 30 
day warranty. B&F Repair. 
576-3869, Hamlin. Service all 
makes. 45-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom 
house located north of town 
to be moved. Asking $2,500. 
Call 735-3263. _______41-tfc

NEW: A full line of C.R. 
Gibson Gift Books, thank you 
notes, and stationery by Eaton 
Paper Company. At the News- 
paper Office.___________ 8-tfc

FOR SALE: Refrigerator, 
washer, dryer, color TV, 
deep freeze and apartment 
size stove. Call before 9:00 or 
after 5:00. B«feF Repair, 
576-3869, Hamlin. Service all 
makes.______________45-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, brick home, with 10-15 
acres cleared land. Six miles 
out Hamlin Highway. Con­
tact J. Atkins, Box 628, 
Kerrville, Tex. 78028. 45-4tc

FUR BUYER
Starting Dec. 7th repre­

sentative of Higginbottom 
Fur Co. will be in Rotan 
every Sunday to buy furs at 
Rotan Restaurant, 10:00 to 
10:30 a.m. A.M. Higginbot­
tom, Fur Co., 4 miles West 
Highway 36, Box 291, Cross 
Plains, Tex. 76443, 817-725-
7350._______________45-3tp

NOTICE: Fur buyer will be 
in Roby at the Phillips 66 
Truck Stop on U.S. 180 from 
12-12:30 every Friday start­
ing Dec. 24th. Red Veale Fur 
Company, Vernon Hayden, 
buyer, 817-559-3584. 45-4tp

HAND MADE GIFTS
Vera’s Gift Shop. Open 9 to 11 
a.m. and 1 to 5 p.m. 908 E. 8th, 
St..Rotan._________  49-tfc

MINNOWS for sale, 405 
E. Lee, Rotan 735-3475. 34tfc

UNUSUAL GIFT ITEMS: See
our all new selections of gift 
items including the Hallmark 
pen line at the Newspaper 
Office. .8-tfc_______________

FOR SALE: The J.O.
Kennedy home, 706 E. 
Burnside. 2,000 sq. ft., 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, large living 
area. Call Joe Kennedy, 
521-749-6282.________46-4tc

FULL LINE OF BOOKS: As a
service to our Fisher County 
friends and customers we have 
taken on a full line of religious 
and inspirational books by 
Tyndall House, makers of the 
Living Bible. Stop by our new 
location and select a gift that 
keeps on giving. We gift wrap 
free. 13-tfp

ROTO ROOTER SERVICE:
Roby Hardware has Roto Rooter 
Service. We are in business on 
your account. Let us serve you. 
Call 776-2131. 13-tfc

GENERAL BLACKSMITH 
WORK: Welding sweep
sharpening. Our specialty 
laying moleboard points, 
buster points. Your business 
will be appreciated. Willard 
Burk, 4V2 miles East of 
Roby.______________ 48-3tp

FOR SALE: 1969 Ford 
pickup, y* ton, V-8, 360 
engine. $700, call 776-2713, 
Rex Beauchamp. 46-tfc

FOR LEASE: 265 acres for 
lease, cultivated. 8Vi miles 
SW Rotan, Jack Bruce. Call 
735-3258.___________ 48-4tp

FOR SALE: McBeth house 
and part of land, 7 miles East 
Rotan. Financing available. 
See H. Thompson or Joe 
Dale Burk.___________48-tfc

MATTRESSES: New and
renovated. Choice color, firm­
ness and size. Save on 
renovating. Guaranteed. Made 
by Western Mattress Co. Call 
735-3421, J&J Supply, Rotan. In 
Roby call 776-9211, leave name.

41-tfc

NOTICE: For Northrum King 
seed see or call Mark Mahaffey, 
776-2760._____________ l5-tfc

FOR SALE: House at 207 
W. Johnston, Call 735-2567, 
Rotan._______ 46_______

FOR SALE: AKC register­
ed Doberman Pinscher pup­
pies, reasonably priced. Call 
817-989-2855, Aspermont. 
___________________ 45-3tp

TV SERVICE: For televi­
sion repair call Home 
Lumber 735-2421. 46-tfc

FOR TERRACING: Now is
the time to rebuild your 
terraces or clean out the top 
terrace channels. CalL Jack 
McClure, 776-2229 or 776- 
2448. 44-6tc

FOR SALE: 1975 Dodge 
Colt. 735-3063 or go by 909 
E. 5th, Rotan.________ 48-tfc

FOR SALE: green vinyl 
recliner, good condition. Call 
776-2739 after 5:00. 48-2tc

STENCILS: Need to print 
your cotton trailer or letter a 
mail box. The Newspaper Office 
has painting and printing 
stencils from one inch to 6 
inches tall. 8-tfc

NOTICE: Water pill and 
laxatives may deplete your 
body’s essential Potassium- 
ask for K Forte’ Noles Drug, 
Roby.______________ 48-3tp

WANTED: Mature lady to 
work 5 to 6 nights a week. 
Apply in person at Dairy 
Queen, Rotan._______ 43-tfc

FOR SALE: 1976 Toyota 
pickup. Call Joe Kennedy, 
512-749-6282.________46-4tc

NEW HOME SEWING MA­
CHINES: The best, Paul
Stevens Discount Machines. 
1713 E. 14th St., Sweetwater, 
235-9791.______________8-tfc

SEWING MACHINE: Sales 
and service. Also Electrolux 
Vacuum Cleaners. See or call H. 
Stevens, 1101 James Street, 
Sweetwater, call 235-2889.12-tfc

FOR SALE: 1972 Cheyen­
ne pickup, Chev., new 
motor, loaded, 735-2983, 
Rotan.______________46-2tc

SAFEMARK BATTERIES
available at Farm Tractor 
and Service, Inc._____ 36-tfc

MONUMENTS AND CEME­
TERY CURBING: J.B. Smith, 
308 E. 4th St., Rotan, Texas, 
call 735-3290. 22-tfc

CAMP SPRINGS WELDING:
Shop welding done at shop or on 
your farm. Call 573-6045. 26-tfc

LOST: 1 black springing 
leifer with missing ear. Has 
•ed ear tag-M.W. 30. Last 
seen in Hobbs vicinity. Call 
735-3263.____________48-tfc

FOR LEASE: 850 acres in 
Kent County, 300' acres in 
farm. Would lease farm and 
keep grass. Call 735-3359, 
L.E. Latham, Rotan, Texas. 
___________________ 48-2tp

REWARD: $200 reward 
for information leading to the 
arrest and conviction of the 
persons that killed my goats 
on the J.A. McClain farm 
north of town Sunday, Jan. 
9. Contact Sheriff’s Dept. 
Stonewall or Fisher County. 
____________________ ^ I t

FOR SALE: 150 gallon 
front mounted polyethylin 
tank complete with hoses,, 
gauges, cut off, and front 
p ro  pump. This spray rig 
was used 1 year only on 200 
row acres. Fits on John 
Deere tractor with front 
p ro . Call 735-2912. 48-2tc

FARM FOR SALE: to
Settle E state- 174 acres 
located 3 miles west of 
Rotan, Texas on Farm Road 
611 (North side of the road). 
Buyer will receive at least 
one-half of the minerals. 
Sealed bids will be received 
by the Estate of Lois 
McCombs, Deceased, until 
11:30 a.m. Thursday, Febru­
ary 10, 1977. Selles reserve 
the right to reject any bid not 
deemed adequate. Terms: 
Cash with 10% of purchase 
price to be deposited as 
earnest money upon execu­
tion of sales contract. Time 
will be given to process 
loans. Submit bids to LaVern 
McCombs, Independent Ex­
ecutor, c/o Norman Arnett, 
Attorney-at-Law, Box 340, 
Rotan, Texas. 46-3tc

NOTICE: If the person 
who took our orange digital 
clock and the brown and 
black digital clock will come 
in, we will give you the boxes 
and gift wrap them. You 
have a guarantee on them. 
The Newspaper Office. 48-tfp

FOR SALE: 1970 Camaro 
SS, call 776-2198, Roby, after 
5 p.m.______________ 48-2tc

SALE: Fantastic buys in 
Housewares now-25 % off. 
Roby Hardware, Roby, Tex­
as. 48-2tc

25% OFF: All housewares 
at Roby Hardware, Roby, 
Texas.______________48-2tc

FOR SALE: 1970 Ford 
Maverick, automatic and air. 
Good condition. Phone 735- 
2447. Fred Thomas. 48-tfc

FOR SALE: Shelled pe­
cans, 1 lb. bags only, $2.50. 
E.L. Yeats, 776-2472. 48-3tp

NOTICE: Get results from 
your cotton burs the first 
year with an application of 
32-0-0 liquid fertilizer.

McClure’s Feed and Ferti- 
lizer, 776-2448. 45-3tc

t*X’«VAW*v.v.*.v.v.v*r.w.v.*»vi%v.%v,̂ ;
I  Hungry?
^ Call i
I Hatahoe |
§ 735-3161 776-2259;:|
I.*”!!?...,.

ITEX A C O I

S & L TEXACO
and Auto Parte

Specializing In 
Engine Tone Ups 

735-3200

WANTED: Your Butane anu 
Propane Business. Phone 
735-3378. Ned’s Fuel Service, 
Rotan._______________ 17-tfc

FOR SALE: Early Ameri­
can hide-a-bed, A. Brandt, 
reg. size bed. Also, large 
Wizard refrigerator-freezer. 
Call 776-2596 after 5:00 p.m. 
___________________ 48-ltc

FOR SALE: 3 good lots 
located at the corner of 
Lakeview and 8th Streets, 
Rotan. Total price for all 
three lots, $1,250.00. Nor­
man Arnett, Box 340, Rotan, 
Texas, (915) 735-2236 or 
735-2516. 48-tfc

For every occasion I
I

N E W S P A P E R  o f f i c e !

7 3 5 -2 5 6 2

Drs. Blum 
AND Nesbitt

OPTOMETRISTS
1825 25th Street 
Snyder, Texas 
Phone 573-3992

O F F IC E  C L O S E S  
N OON W E D . & S A T .

TERMITE-PEST CONTIOl

SERVICE OF 
INTEGRITY

Texas Structural Pest 
Control Ucense # 207-0

ME MB E R
TEXAS PEST CONTROL ASSOCIATION  

N AH O N Al PEST CONTROL ASSOCIATION  
BIU  DEAVERS

Off. 915-373-7230
P. O. BOX 982 
SNYDER. TEXAS

R onald  B. G reen
GENERAL CONCRETE WORK

CONCRETE AND LABOR CONSTRUCTION 
CEMETERY CURBING - YARD CURBS 

WALKS AND DRIVES - PATIOS

Box E 776-2108 Roby, Texas

Texas
Farmers
Union

BT̂ Get Into 

The Fight 

For Parity

"FARMER POWER” With Farmers Union
S U P P O R T  T H E

Farmers Union

X-

♦  
*

*

* 

♦
5 x 7 ...........$1.50
8x 10....................... $2.50 4-

4

Pictures
Available

Any Photo Taken 
By Kim Pease

B l a c k  & W h ite

Copies Can Be 
Ordered

t Newspaper Office 1
♦ ;♦ 75d-zdoz or / /o-zzyz 4
♦ *^ Rotan - Roby 4
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pound Duroc.
In the lamb division, the 

champion finewool and me­
dium wool was shown by 
Mark Harris of Rotan. Brad 
Stuart and Britt Stuart of 
Roby combined to win the 
champion fine wood cross, 
the reserve medium wool 
and reserve southdown. 
Robin Harris of Rotan 
showed the Champion South- 
down. Ricky Spencer of Roby 
showed the reserve champ­
ion finewood and fmewood 
cross. Mark and Robin 
Harris are the children of 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Harris. 
Parents of the Stuart bro­
thers are Mr. and Mrs. 
Freddie Stuart. Ricky Spen­
cer is the son of County 
Agent and Mrs. Richard 
Spencer. James Evatt, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Evatt of 
Rotan, had the three ^top 
placing rabbits in the show.

In the Beef Heifer divi­
sion, Clay Wilfong of Rotan, 
showed the Grand Champion 
heifer, an Angus. Clay is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Wilfong. The Reserve Grand 
Champion was a hereford 
belonging to Brad Stuart.

The Grand Champion 
Steer was shown by Fonda 
Jeffrey of Sylvester. The 
steer was a 1120 pound 
Limousine-Angus Cross. 
Fonda is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Jeffrey. The 
Reserve Champion was a 967 
pound Angus belonging to 
Clay Wilfong.

The showmanship trophies 
wee won by Lance Greenway 
-swine; Mark Harris-lambs; 
Danny Terry-cattle. The 
trophies were sponsored by 
the Fisher County Young 
Farmers.

Individual winnings are 
listed below:

Rabbits
1., 2., 3. James Evatt. 

Market Swine
feeder Pigs. 1. Robert 

Posey, 2. Jamie Walker, 3. 
Mike Walker, 4. Tim Counts,
5. Loyd Messick, 6. Wayne 
Harvey, 7. Jackie Shipp, 8. 
Damon Shipp, 9. Belynda 
Stuart, 10. Bob McArthur.

Lightweight. 1. Kellie 
Pease, 2. Lance Greenway,
3. Keith Walker, 4. Damon 
Shipp, 5. Jackie Shipp, 6. 
Mark Yates, 7. Wayne 
Harvey, 8. & 9. Terry
Bredemeyer, 10. James 
Kemp.

Middleweight. 1. Jamie 
Walker, 2. Mark Cooker, 3. 
Damon Shipp, 4. Sharon 
Stuart, 5. Debbie Stuart, 6. 
Jay Greenway, 7. Donnie 
Mullins, 8. Damon Shipp, 9. 
Bobby Swafford, 10. Jay 
Greenway.

Light Heavyweight. 1. 
K6ith Walker, 2. Todd 
Goodwin, 3. Jackie Ragan, 4. 
Max Kemp, 5. Belynda 
Stuart, 6. Kip Pease, 7. 
Perry Thomson, 8. John Cox, 
9. Dale Cox, 10. John Cox.

Heavyweight. 1. Jamie 
Walker, 2. & 3. Todd
Goodwin, 4. Mike Walker, 5. 
Darrell Carter, 6. James 
Kemp, 7. Dale Cox, 8. James 
Kemp, 9. Reggie Counts, 10. 
Jackie Ragan. Grand Chap- 
ion Jamie Walker, Reserve 
Champion Todd Qoodwin. 

Market Lambs 
Light Finewool. 1. Ricky 

Spencer, 2. David Ether- 
edge, 3. Annette Overyby, 4. 
Shannon Strickland, 5. Jeff 
Anderle, 6. odd Ether edge.

Heavy Finewood. 1. Mark 
Harris, 2. Ricky Spencer, 3. 
Mark Harris, 4. Reggie 
Parks, 5. Mike McGrew. 
Champion Finewool Mark 
Harris-Heavyweight. Reser­
ve, Ricky Spencer-Heavy- 
weight.

Light Finewool Cross. 1. 
Ricky Spencer, 2. Jim Ratliff,
3. Roy Nichols, 4. Mike 
McGrew, 5. Annette Overby, 
6. Dean Nichols.

Heavy Finewool Cross. 1. 
Brad Stuart, 2. David 
Etheredge, 3. Ricky Spencer,
4. Mike McGrew, 5. Todd 
Etheredge, 6. Beverly Mc­
Kinney. Champion Finewool 
Cross-Brad Stuart-Heavy- 
weight. Reserve Champion- 
Ricky Spencer-Lightweight.

Light Medium Wool. 1. 
Annette Overby. 2. Tab 
Hines, 3. Dean Nichols, 4. 
Wes Hardin, 5. Carla Young, 
6. Russell Smith.

Heavy Medium Wool. 1. 
Mark Harris, 2. Britt Stuart, 
3. Mark Harris, 4. Todd 
Etheredge, 5. Robert Wall, 
6. Bobby Benavides. Cham­
pion Medium Wool-Mark

Harris-heavyweight. Reser­
ve Champion-Britt Stuart-
H e a v y w c ig h t .

Light Southdown. 1. Wes 
Hardin, 2. Reggie Parks, 3. 
& 4. Naomi Counts, 5. Carla 
Young, 6. LaRhea Smith.

Heavy Southdown. 1. 
Robin Harris, 2. Brad Stuart,
3. Robin Harris, 4. & 5. Britt 
Stuart, 6. Russell Smith. 
Champion Southdown, Robin 
Harris-Heavyweight. Reser­
ve Champion, Brad Stuart- 
Heavyweight.

Breeding Heifers 
Angus. January 1-Aug. 

31, 1975. 1. Clay Wilfong. 
Sept. 1,1975-Jan. 1976, 1. 
Clay Wilfong, 2. Mike 
Walker, 3. Mark Henderson,
4. Lynda Henderson. 

Hereford. Jan. 1 to Aug.
31, 1975. 1. Brad Stuart, 2. 
Jill Wright, 3. Jan Wright. 
Sept. 1, 1975 to January 
1976. 1. Britt Stuart, 2. 
Renee Underwood, 3. Mark 
Anderle.

Shorthorn. 1. Ray Sharp- 
stein. Grand Champion Hei­
fer, Clay Wilfong, Angus. 
Reserve Champion, Brad 
Stuart, Anged Hereford, 

steers
Light English Breeds. 1. 

Mark Nowlin, 2. Darren 
Jeffrey, 3. Laurence Wea­
therman, 4. Judy Weather­
man, 5. Darren Jeffrey, 6. 
James Jeffrey, 7. Max 
Kemp, 8. Cherrie McKin­
ney, 9. Carla Young, 10. 
Todd Stevenson.

Middle English Breeds. 1. 
Clay Wilfong, 2. Darren 
Jeffrey, 3. cheryl Terry, 4. 
Mike Terry, 5. Blake Hale, 6. 
Gary Don Harkey, 7. Brad 
Stuart, 8. Britt Stuart, 9. Jay 
Greenway, 10. Jill Wright.

Light Exotic Crosses. 1. 
Alan Kiker, 2. Jennifer 
Wright, 3. Tony Terry, 4. 
Spencer Houston, 5. Tony 
Terry, 6. Manuel Garcia, 7. 
Butch Houston, 8. Don 
Denman.

Heavy Exotic Crosses. 1. 
Fonda Jeffrey, 2. Clay 
Wilfong, 3. James Jeffrey, 4. 
Clay Wilfong, 5. Gary Don 
Harkey, 6. Butch Houston, 7. 
Danny Terry, 8 Shiela 
Jeffrey, 9. Darren Jeffrey, 
10. Jeff Upshaw.

BRAD STUART WITH RESERVE CHAMPION LAMB ROTAN BAND BANQUET SHOT

ROBIN HARRIS WITH GRAND CHAMPION LAMB

i  I r '4 ■' ^  !§:

BANQUET CANDID

wmmm

McMurry Annual Fund 
Drive Began Jan. 10

your/ M  ndepenient 
Insurance k m  /AGENT

’SiRVIS/ YOU 'FIRST'

Deaton
Insurance Agency

776-2228
Ed Deaton-Agent-Roby,  Texas

FONDA JEFFERY WITH EXOTIC GRAND CHAMPION

Raymond McDaniel Jr.. 
Abilene district chairman for 
the McMurry Annual Fund, 
says that area kickoffs for 
this year’s drive will be held 
the week of Jan. 10-14.

L.W. Cain, Abilene dis­
trict advance gifts chairman, 
will announce his early total 
at the first event, a 6:30 p.m. 
dinner Monday, Jan. 10, in 
Fairmont United Methodist 
Church of Abilene.

The McMurry Annual 
Fund provides financial sus- 
tentation for the Abilene 
college which belongs to the 
Northwest Texas and New 
Mexico Conferences of the 
United Methodist Church.

At the Fairmont dinner 
will be campaign workers 
from Caps, Buffalo Gap, 
Hawley, Merkel, Tuscola 
and Tye, Abilene churches 
represented at the Monday 
dinner were Epworth, Fair­
mont, Fair Park, Grace, 
Plum Street, Wylie and 
Pioneer Memorial.

Sweetwater First WMC 
hosted a breakfast at 7 a.m. 
Tuesday, Jan. 11. With

Sweetwater workers were 
those from Trent, Shep, 
Nolan, and Blackwell.

Clyde First UMC hosted a 
7 a.m. kickoff breakfast 
Wednesday. Jan. 12. Cam­
paign workers from Albany. 
Moran. Eula, Baird, Hamby 
and Potosi joined those from 
Clyde.

Aldcrsgate WMC in Abi­
lene hosted a 12 noon 
luncheon kickoff also Wed., 
Jan. 12. Other churches in 
Abilene sending representa­
tives were Elmwood West, 
St. James, First Church and 
St. Paul.

, The kickoff in the Roby 
area will be a 7 a.m. 
Thursday, Jan. 13. breakfast 
in Roby’s Silver Spur Cafe. 
Workers from Hamlin, Mc- 
Caulley, Longworth, Rotan, 
Anson, and Sylvester will 
join those from Roby at the 
event.

The Rev. Jim Pickens, 
Abilene UMC district super­
intendent, and representa­
tives . of McMurry College 
will be on hand for the 
gatherings.

Dire<tory Assistance Charging

We don’t want 
your 20<

TODD GOODWIN WITH RESERVE CHAMPION SWINE

V al^ itines
Monday, 

February f4

Your personal envoy 
of good taste

NEW SP APER
OFFICE

735-2562
01976 Ambosscxlor Cordi, 

o division o l Holmorfc Cords, Inc.

Celebrate Val^itine’s Day
...with our Ambassador paper partyware. Heart and Lace paper 
partyware makes entertaining fun. Easy, too!

NEWSPAPER OFFICE
“ A F U L L  L IN E  O F  O F F I C E  S U P P L I E S  & G I F T S ” 

R O T A N , T E X A S 735-2562
©1976 Am bassador Cards, a  d ivision of HalliTXjrk Cards, Inc.

Directory Assistance charging is now in effect 
statewide.
Basically, the plan calls for charging 20 cents 
for every call to Directory Assistance over the 
first 10 made during a monthly billing period. 
Quite frankly, we don’t want your 20 cents. 
Our objective in charging for Directory 
Assistance is to reduce the spiraling cost of 
providing the service — a cost that has sky­
rocketed due to misuse rather than wise use. 
Studies showed that some customers call 
Directory Assistance 25, 50 or 100 times a 
month from their homes. Some businesses 
called more than 2,000 times a month! And 
yet, 75 percent of the numbers requested 
were in the telephone directory.
Yet, the cost of excessive use of Directory 
Assistance was borne by all telephone 
rate-payers. Thus, we introduced the charge 
because it is the only way we can handle the 
rising costs of Directory Assistance fairly. 
The people who use Directory Assistance the 
most will now pay the most.
Here’s how the plan works:
Customers with single-line basic service who 
call Directory Assistance (1411) more than 
10 times during a monthly billing period will 
be charged 20 cents for every call after their 
tenth. A maximum of two numbers may be 
requested during each call to Directory 
Assistance. Multi-line customers will have an 
additional allowance of one call for each line, 
up to 25 lines.
The Directory Assistance Charge also 

j applies to calls for numbers in other towns 
within your home Area Code — with one

Exem ption Requests 
Southwestern Bell 
P.O. Box 5521 
Dallas, Texas 75222

important exception. You won’t be charged 
for calling Directory Assistance in another 
town that has the same Area Code as yours 
provided you make a corresponding Long 
Distance call within your home Area Code. 
That call has to be placed from and billed to 
your own phone within the same monthly 
billing cycle.
To request numbers in other towns with the 
same Area Code as yours, continue to dial 
1-555-1212.
There is no charge for requesting numbers 
that have a different Area Code than yours. 
Just dial 1, plus the Area Code, then 555-1212. 
Also, there is no charge for Directory 
Assistance calls from coin telephones or 
from hospitals.
Some customers not charged. - -  -
Visually and physically handicapped people 
who are unable to use the directory will be 
exempt from the charge. If you think you, or 
someone in your family, or a friend may be 
entitled to this exemption, please fill out the 
coupon below for more information.
If you’re like most people, you’ll never be 
affected by the Directory Assistance charge. 
In fact, in cities where Directory Assistance 
charging was already in effect with a five-call 
allowance, only 5 percent of customers were 
ever charged each month.
More importantly, 95 percent were not. This 
certainly indicates that 10 free calls a month 
will more than meet your needs if you can’t 
find a number in the directory.
So look in the book before you call. It will 
save you 20 cents that we don’t want.

Please have someone contact me concerning an exemption certificate for the 
Directory Assistance Charging Plan.

street Address. -City. -Zip

Telephone NumberfP/ease Include Area Code) .

Southwestern Bell


