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Students Are 
Off To 
Colleges

Local and area students are 
off to colleges and univer­
sities and the News office has 
made an effort to list them 
along with their respective 
institutions.

Garland’s Beauty School, 
Abilene -  Tammie Huff, Cin­
dy Reynolds

Heather’s Beauty School, 
Abilene -- Angie Walling 

Institute of Hair Design, 
Abilene -  Andy Barnard, Jeff 
Quintana

Christ For The Nations 
College, Dalis -  Russell 
Hacker

McMurry College, Abilene - 
- Barry Sutton 

Texas Tech University , 
Lubbock -  Jay Rutherford, 
Kelley Boone, Mark Clonts, 
Kay Howell, Angelia Reid, 
David Counts, Patti Counts, 
Brett Boone, Kenneth Wayne 
Williams II

Vernon Regional Junior 
College “  Mary Albus, Chuck 
Hutchinson, Danny Alsides, 
Kelly Watson

Texas State Technical In­
stitute, Sweetwater -  Arturo 
Rocha, Jackie Vaden 

University of Texas at 
Austin -  Junior Gonzales 

Angelo State University, 
San Angelo -  Scott Lynn, 
Staci Eaton

Stenograph Institute, 
Abilene -  Kimberly Whitley 

North Texas State Univer­
sity, Denton -  Adam White 

Odessa Junior College -  
Amber Ashcraft 

Abilene Christian Univer­
sity -  Greg Elston

THE CITIZENS STATE BANK

Citizens State Bank 
Begins New Expansion

Did You Know...
that Dr. and Mrs. Lynn 
Beason 1803 C. Treehouse 
Trail, College Station, Texas 
77804 subscribe to The Knox 
County News!

Bruce B. Campbell Jr., 
president of Citizens State 
Bank in Knox City, has ad­
vised the News that plans are 
currently underway for 
enlarging facilities of the 
bank.

A contracting firm, which 
specializes in bank construc­
tion, will begin the new work 
in the near future, Campbell 
said, with plans calling for a 
20-foot addition, from front to 
back, along the entire west 
wall of the existing building. 
The drive-in window again 
will be located on the west 
side of the building and will 
be manned during banking

hours, Campbell said. He 
reminded drive-in customers 
to enter from the back of the 
bank on Avenue A.

The new exterior will be of 
light face brick to match the 
existing brick and a vertical 
glass entry opening directly 
into the new addition will 
match the glass entry into the 
bank’s foyer. The 
“ alumilited” aluminum trim 
on the new addition and 
fasica canopy of the drive-in 
facility will also match the 
existing trim.

The proposed one-story ad­
dition will contain three 
rooms including a com-

To Meet Munday Saturday

Hounds Claw 
Panthers, 25 - 12

By DAVID COUNTS
When you get a break you 

should use it to your advan­
tage. The Knox City 
Greyhounds did just that 
F'riday night in the 
Greyhound stadium. They 
piled up a 25-6 halftime lead, 
then held on for a 25-12 win 
over the visiting Seymour 
Panthers.

The Greyhound defense 
took charge early. Looking 
200 percent improved from a 
week ago, the defense set up 
the first Knox City score 
when they forced a bad snap 
on a fourth down punt giving 
the Hounds the ball on the 
Seymour 14 yard line. Two 
plays later, Dwayne Watkins 
passed 10 yards to Ricky 
Gutierrez for the touchdown. 
A pass attempt for two points 
failed.

On the first play of the 
second quarter. Ranee 
Hacker intercepted a pass 
and returned it 27 yards to the 
Seymour 47 yard line. The 
Hound offense moved to the 
Panther five yard line behind 
good blocking and the hard 
running of Steve Lynn and 
Ricky Gutierrez but could not 
score. The defense caused a 
Seymour fumble on their first 
play and alert Glen 
Hedgecoke recovered on the 
six yard line.

On the second play, James 
Stafford scored on a two yard 
run. David Flores kicked the 
extra point to make the score 
13-0.

The Seymour team scored 
the next time they got the ball 
on a 32 yard pass from Mark 
Machen to Tommy Sullivan. 
Point after try failed.

This Panther score upset 
the Hound offense’s peaceful 
attitude. Taking the kickoff to 
the Hound 28, Ricky 
Gutierrez ran for 12 yards. 
Watkins then passed to Kevin 
Leach for 42 yards. Gutierrez 
ran for nine more yards 
before Watkins ran into the 
endzone for a nine yard 
touchdown. Again the kick

failed. Score 19-6.
With 43 seconds left in the 

first half, Kevin Leach inter­
cepted a pass and returned it 
20 yards to the Panther 20 
yard line. Watkins passed for 
17 yards to Leach. Stafford 
then scored on a three yard 
run with 28 seconds left. Ex­
tra point try failed, score at 
half, 25-6.

Glen Hedgecoke killed any 
hope Seymour had to score 
again in the first half when he 
recovered a loose ball on the 
Panther 34 as time ran out.

Some excellent defensive 
plays were made in the first 
halL Todd Lewis spent a lot of 
time in the Panther backfield 
causing the Panthers lots of 
problems. Wayne Hutchinson 
made several outstanding 
tackles as did David Flores, 
Mike Oliver, and Ricky 
Gutierrez.

The second half was all 
defense for the Hounds. The 
Panthers made good drivers 
time and time again only to 
have the Hounds stop them 
short of the goal line until late 
in the contest.

To open the second half, the 
Panthers drove to the Hounds 
19 before Richard Daniel 
recovered a fumble. Unable 
to move the ball in three 
plays, Watkins boomed a 50 
yard punt to get the Hounds

First Downs 
Yards Rushing 
Yards Passing 
Passes Completed 
Passes Intercepted By 
Punts
Fumbles Lost 
Yards Penalized

out of the hole.
The next serious Panther 

threat was stopped when 
Steve Lynn recovered fumble 
on the Hound 28 yard line.

With 34 seconds left in the 
game many second team 
members on the field for the 
Hounds, the Panthers scored 
on an 18 yard pass. The try 
for extra point failed and the 
game ended 25-12.

The temperature was hot 
during the game causing 
cramps to several players. 
Several Hounds had to play 
different positions and did so 
with great success. Richard 
Daniel played a new position 
on defense and did an ex­
cellent job.

Next week, the Hounds 
travel to Munday to play on 
Saturday night at 8:00 
o’clock. This will be Mon­
day’s homecoming and the 
first time that the Hounds will 
get to play against a Rogers 
Lankford coached team. It 
should be an excellent game. 
Neither team has lost this 
year.

Results from some of the 
District 4-A team this week 
are Rule 27, Abilene Christian 
High School 13; Aspermont 
37, Hawley 8; Chillicothe 6, 
Paducah 58; Rochester 0, 
Motley County 49; Throck­
morton 7, Archer City 6.

KC
11
120
99
5 of 15 
2
4/35
1
4-40

S 
15 
138 
118 
7 of 14 
2
2/36
4
5-35

Score By Quarters
KC 6 19 0 0
SEYMOUR 0 6 0 6
KC 6 -14 yd. pass Watkins to R. Gutierrez, pass failed 
KC 6 - Two yard run Stafford,
KC 1 - Flores Kick
S 6 - Mark Machen 32 yard pass to Sullivan, pass failed 
KC 6 - Nine Yard Watkins run, kick failed 
KC 6 - Three yard run Stafford, pass failed 
S 6 -18 yard pass Machen to Sullivan, run failed

25
12

munity room and board room 
on the south, opening directly 
to the street. The large 20’ by 
26’6” room will contain a cof­
fee bar and large coat closet 
with quarry tile along the en­
try and the remainder of the 
room in plush carpet. North 
of the community-board 
room will be a work room and 
the drive-in teller facilities. 
The back room will be used 
for storage along with a 
corridor containing em­
ployees’ lockers. An outside 
door will open on the north, 
also, rather than on the west 
as the present one does.

Organized in 1920, the 
Citizens State Bank is 
capable of handling any type 
commercial banking from 
stocks and bonds to savings 
accounts and certificates of 
deposit. The bank is a mem­
ber of the Federal Deposit In­
surance Corporation and all 
accounts are insured up to 
$100,000.00.

The bank’s first home was 
in the building now occupied 
by the Knox City Mini Mall. 
Officials purchased the 
O’Brien Bank in 1922 and 
moved later to the building 
now occupied by Clonts Har­
dware.

In 1932, the Citizens State 
Bank merged with the First 
National Bank and moved to 
the building where the City 
Hall is now located. The Ben­
jamin Bank was purchased in 
1933, and in 1954, work began 
on the new, modern bank 
building in its present 
location.

Bank officers include 
Bruce B. Campbell Jr., 
president and chairman of 
the board; Evelyn Shelton 
and Greg Clonts, vice 
presidents; Bertha Driver, 
cashier; and Pansy Russell 
and Leona Burkham, 
assistant cashiers.

Directors include Cam­
pbell, Sam E. Clonts, Greg 
Clonts, Henry L. White, 
Henry J. Jones, and J.M. 
Averitt.

Smorgasbord Set
The Knox City Band 

Boosters will sponsor a Band 
Smorgasbord, Friday, Sep­
tember 18, from 6:00 to 7:30 
p.m. in the school cafeteria.
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Farm Bureau 
Convention 
September 26

The Knox County Farm 
Bureau will hold its annual 
county convention on Satur­
day night, September 26, at 
the Munday High School.

A catered barbecue will be 
served beginning at 6:30. If 
there are those who have not 
already purchased advance 
tickets, they are asked to 
come by the Farm Bureau of­
fice. Farm Bureau officials 
are asking a one dollar 
deposit per plate be paid 
which will be refunded upon 
presentation of tickets at the 
convention. Those who do not 
purchase advance tickets will 
be charged $3.50 at the door.

A short business meeting 
will follow the meal and 
Bingo will follow. Members 
are asked to make plans to be 
there and help make this 
year’s convention a success.

Area Men Enjoy 
1700 Mile Trip

Seven area men enjoyed a 
five state 1,700 mile motor­
cycle tour last week that took 
them through northwest 
Texas, New Mexico, 
Colorado, Kansas, and 
Oklahoma.

The group included Bobby 
Jones, Gerald Cheek, Everett 
Vance, and John 
McGaughey, all of Stamford, 
Gary Muehlstein of Avoca, 
and Jim Potteiger and Ken 
Lawson, both of Knox City.

The men tent camped part 
of the time in the mountains 
of New Mexico and Colorado 
and Ken reported that he 
gained weight on John 
McGaughey’s cooking.

Lawson also reported that 
the tops of the passes were 
covered with snow one mor­
ning and the natives of 
Colorado said there would be 
an early winter.

Robinson Hired To 
Lubbock AJ Staff

Lubbock Avalanche Jour­
nal Executive Sports Editor 
Norval PoUard has announ­
ced the hiring of 1977 Knox 
City-O’Brien High School 
graduate Kelly Robinson as a 
parttime writer for the AJ.

Kelly will be covering local 
and area high school football 
for the AJ this fall and will be 
solely responsible for com­
piling statistics for the Class 
AAA Districts in the AJ 
publication area.

A senior at Tech, Kelly is 
also Student Assistant Sports 
Information Director for the 
Red Raider athletic depar­
tment. He credits the ex­

perience he received through 
the Kennel Staff and the Knox 
County News as being large 
factors in his new job.

“ The experience I gained 
while attending KCHS and 
being on the Kennel staff has 
really paid off for me in Lub­
bock,” Kelly said. “ The Knox 
County News helped to create 
visions of the future for me in 
the journalism field and I feel 
that has enabled me to do 
some things I never would 
have had the opportunity to 
have done otherwise.”

Kelly is the grandson of 
Mrs. Guy Robinson of Knox 
City.

With Management Services

Right ‘Power’ Now 
Behind KC Hospital

By BILLYE ANGLE
Area and local residents 

may rest assured, as the right 
‘Power’ is in the driver’s seat 
at the Knox County Hospital.

The Power referred to in 
the above paragraph is none 
other than Dan Powers who 
owns and operates Dan 
Powers Management Ser­
vices of Brownfield, a very 
unique service in that he 
moves into a hospital with a 
personal interest in seeing 
that both the patient and the 
hospital benefit from proper 
management procedures. He 
analyzes the needs of the 
hospital and after setting up 
the books and getting a 
hospital off on the right road, 
he then chooses a resident- 
administrator to follow his 
proposed guidelines. He has a 
re g u la r  ‘ fo l lo w -u p ”  
procedure to insure that his 
instructions are being carried 
out, also.

Powers, 
management 
tracts with 
F lo y d a d a ,

who has 
services con- 
hospitals in 
S p earm an ,

DAN POWERS
...hospital manager

Muleshoe, and Amherst, was 
an auditor with Blue Cross- 
Blue Shield ten years ago. He 
later served as administrator 
for Brownfield Regional 
Medical Center and became 
active in the Texas Hospital 
Association. It was during 
this time that he realized the 
need for proper management 
which many hospitals fail to 
achieve, and said he was

Munday Continues 
Pursuit of Doctors

Sirloin Dinner 
To Be Given Away

A Sirloin for Two dinner 
will be given away to some 
lucky person who con­
tributes to the upcoming 
Bloodmobile, Tuesday, Sep­
tember 29.

Vic and Sandra Edwards, 
owners of The Cotton Patch 
Cafe, will provide the dinner 
to the person whose name is 
drawn from the list of donors.

This Bloodmobile will be 
dedicated to Joy Spikes, who 
recently returned to her 
home in Knox City after un­
dergoing heart surgery.

The Munday Chamber of 
Commerce and Agriculture is 
actively pursuing a medical 
doctor for Munday.

At a recent ‘town hall’ 
meeting approximately 150 
interested citizens voiced 
support of the Chamber in the 
plan of operation adopted by 
the Chamber. W.O. Smith, 
chairman of a special 
“ Medical Search Commit­
tee” appointed by the Cham­
ber Board of Directors, ad­
vised the Board of the results 
obtained thus far. He stated 
the Chamber had engaged the 
aid of the Texas Doctor’s 
Group, Inc., Austin, Texas, to 
lend their professional exper­
tise in locating doctors who 
will be interviewed by 
telephone and in person.

As of this date, four

KC Jr. 4-H 
To Meet Monday

The Knox City Junior 4-H 
Club will meet Monday, Sep­
tember 21, at 4:15 p.m. at the 
Community Center.

According to April Stamps, 
County Extension Agent, the 
meeting is open to all youth 
ages nine through fourteen 
and everyone is invited and 
encouraged to attend.

Weather
FURNISHED BY PLANT 
MATERIALS CENTER 

4 Miles NW of Knox City

prospects have indicated an 
interest in locating in Mun­
day. A travel schedule is 
being arranged for their 
initial visit at their con­
venience. Funds are being 
solicited from interested per­
sons and lodging for the 
prospects. Pledges are being 
sought also for the long-range 
aid in guarantees for the first 
year of operation for the 
doctor.

A spokesman said that ap­
proximately $12,000.00 is 
needed at this time for travel, 
rent on the doctor’s office, 
and one-half of the fee for the 
professional assistant to the 
Texas Doctor’s Group. More 
than $7,000.00 cash was 
raised at the ‘town hall’ 
meeting with pledges amoun­
ting to an additional $8,000.00.

Since that time the fund has 
increased to $9,260.00 in cash 
and pledges of $15,060.00. In 
order to ensure each con­
tributor that his or her con­
tribution will be tax- 
deductible, checks should be 
made payable to the Munday 
Industrial Foundation, Inc.

Munday has been without a 
doctor for almost three years 
when Dr. Newsom retired. 
County and area residents 
who wish to support the effor­
ts of the Munday Chamber of 
Commerce in this effort are 
requested to call the Cham­
ber office at (817) 422-4540, or 
write to P.O. Drawer L, Mun­
day, TX 76371.

Date Low High Rain
9-8 61 84
9-9 56 86
9-10 63 94
9-11 70 98
9-12 69 97 .28
9-13 68 98 .25
9-14 65 85 .04

Hospital Auxiliary 
To Meet Monday

Members of the Knox Coun­
ty Hospital Auxiliary are 
reminded of their Monday, 
September 21, meeting set for 
7:00 p.m. in the downtown 
thrift shop.

According to president 
Peggy McGaughey, mem­
bership dues of $1.00 are due 
and must be paid at this time.

e sp e c ia lly  sym path etic 
toward the smaller hospitals.

Because of the great need, 
he decided to begin his 
own management services 
business with much emphasis 
on services. The personal 
touch that he injects helps 
create a unity among the ad­
ministrator, the medical 
staff, the hospital personnel, 
the governing board, and the 
community. Lack of leader­
ship and lack of com ­
munication in many small 
hospitals can create unsur- 
mountable problems, he ex­
plained.

Powers said that he was 
very impressed with the 
good, qualified personnel at 
the Knox County Hospital -  
the caring, qualified 
physicians of which the 
community should be very 
proud, the excellent nursing 
staff, and the governing 
board -- good, concerned men 
who have served the com­
munity well in their efforts to 
provide leadership.

Powers said that his real 
concern is to serve the com­
munity, working with the 
medical staff, the hospital 
personnel, and the board of 
directors to make this 
hospital the best possible.

He explained that the 
hospital had endured some 
billing problems and that 
clerks were now in the 
process of sending out hand­
written statements. He is in 
hopes that anyone who 
receives an incorrect 
statement will present it to 
the hospital business office in'̂  
order that the bill may be 
corrected.

Powers said that he was 
very optimistic about the 
future of the Knox County 
Hospital, and all of us should 
be, too, with a dedicated per­
son such as he in charge.

SCHOOLAND 
COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR

Tuesday, September 17 --
Knox City plays Munday, 
there, seventh grade, 5:00; 
eighth grade, 6:00; JV’s, 
7:30; Fire Meeting 7:30; 
KC Study Club Luncheon, 
Community Center, 12 noon.

Friday, September 18 -  
Assembly Program, 11:00 
a.m .; Band Boosters’ 
Sm orgasbord, 6:00-7:30, 
school cafeteria

Saturday, September 19 -
Knox City at Munday for 
their homecoming, 8:00 p.m.

Monday, September 21 --
Volleyball, junior varsity and 
varsity at Hawley, 5:00 p.m.

Tuesday, September 22 ~ Fall 
Begins; RTA Salad Lun­
cheon, 12 noon. Community 
Center; Band Rehearsal, 6:00 
-8:00p.m.

Wednesday, September 23 -
Noon Lions Club, Masonic 
Fellowship Hall; Senior Por­
traits
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►LEGAL NOTICE leg a l  n o u c e

f REAL ESTATE i>MISCELLANEOUS 
FOR SALE (►

MISCELLANEOUS
SERVICES (► CARD OF THANKS i

-DWELLINGS-

TWO BEDROOM BRICK, one bath, kitchen, living room, two car garage, corner lot. Ex­
cellent location, 311 South Central. $35,000.00.

IN O’BRIEN On two lots, two bedroom, living room, kitchen, one bath, utility, all carpeted. 
Lots of storage. TV antenna and fenced yard. Very neat. Cathy Penman home. $20,000.00. 
Excellent buy.

THREE BEDROOM, Large Living Room, Kitchen-dining combination, Playroom, Carport, 
Patio, back fence. Excellent location, 1203 South Second, $32,000.00.

SUDIA CASH HOME - 3 Bedroom, 2 Bath, Kitchen, Family Room, Large Living Room - 
Dining Area. 1 Car Garage, Work Shop, Cellar, fenced backyard. Excellent Location. Shown 
by appointment only. 208 South 2nd. $^,500.00.

O’BRIEN -  Two bedroom, one bath, living room, kitchen with refrigerator. Two blocks nor­
th of school. Good condition. $13,500.00.

BEAUTIFUL THREE Bedrc^m brick, 2^ bath with formal lining room, formal dining 
room, family room, neatly j^ a p ^ p ^ la(cl ^ < J t o t l Q p t s f l ^ u t i l i t y  room, two car 
garage, situated on two lots wftlr^^estaDlished landscaping. 804 S. Aspen, $70,000.

TRAILER HOUSE on one acre, three miles north of Knox City. $15,000.00 Lots of extras.

IF YOU NEED lots of room, here it is. Three bedroom, one and one-half bath, large kitchen, 
dining area, four individual heating and cooling units. Large two bedroom, one bath, utility 
room, living room, kitchen on the back. Could be rent property. Good price at $35,000.00.

ROCHESTER - 2 Bedroom, Kitchen, Dining Room, Living Room with fireplace, utility 
room, storm windows, walls insulated. One block south of school. Excellent buy at 
$10,000.00.

ROCHESTER - 3 bedroom, dining room, TV Room, living room, and loads of extras on 3 
lots. Nice. 2 blocks south of school. Super buy at $17,500.00.

-RESIDENTIAL LOTS-
ONE LOT, 50x100.202 North Avenue C.
LOT IN Shannon Addition.
THREE EXCELLENT lots in Warren Addition. Old house. Excellent buy at $5,000.00.

-c o m m e r c ia l -
in v e s t m e n t  REAL ESTATE - Texaco Service Station with 28,000 gallon storage. Good 
location. Priced to sell.

NICE BUSINESS with excellent potential. Bad health is forcing retirement. Good financing 
available. Norma’s Leather Express. If you have wanted your own business and have a lit­
tle money, this may be what you have been waiting for. Call us.

ROCHESTER - Rochester Tractor Co. building and 3 lots. 70 x 130 foot x 16 ft. wall. Lots of 
area. All steel. Any reasonable offer will be considered. Call for appointment.

-FARM l a n d -
171 ACRES - Four miles west of O’Brien. 110 acres cultivated, 62 acres native pasture. Two 
irrigation wells, no minerals. $425.00 per acre.

326 ACRES, nine miles west on Highway 222. Three bedroom, brick home with three baths, 
large living area, two car garage. 230 acres cultivated balance in pasture. Lots of good out 
buildings. Shown by appointment only. $240,000.00.

WEST OF O’BRIEN ~ Three bedroom trailer house that has been made into a house with a 
woodburning heating system. Carport and three out buildings situated on 24 acres. Leased 
and planted in cotton for 1981. Super buy at $26,500.00. Loan approved with down payment.

ACRES with nice large, older 3 bedroom house, central heat. House could be sold 
seperate with small acreage. Some out buildings, fruit trees, close to town. $75,000.00.

120 ACRES excellent farm land. Salem Hutchinson farm south east of Knox City. Some 
water available. Old house. $1,200.00 per acre.

-MISCELLANEOUS-

1979 100 cc KAWASAKI motorcycle. $450.00. Street bike.

iares
and Shins, parts for tractors, 
plows, trucks, and cars. 
Bearings, oil filters, belts, 
batteries, plugs, points, air 
and fuel filters, chisel spikes, 
duckfoot, sweeps and 
busters, Servis shredder and 
Krause plow parts. Egen- 
bacher Implement, Inc. tfc

SEE YOUR MONUMENTS 
before you buy. More than 50 
designs to choose from. Also 
curb work-. J.C. McGee, tfc
RIVERSIDE CHEMICAL, 
Knox City, would like to help 
you with all your fertilizer 
and chemical needs. Call 
(817)658-3841. tfc
FOR SALE - One registered 
filly yearling. Yellow Wolf 
and Showdown breeding. 
Moorhouse Ranch, Ben­
jamin, Texas (817) 454-2222. 
9-10 2tc

AIRPLANE FOR SALE -  
Cessna Cardinal 177,1200 TT. 
Call 658-3838. 9-17 Itc

STOVE FOR SALE ~ In good 
condition, 1.5 cubic ft. 
refrigerator. Ideal for college 
dorm. Call 658-3762. 9-17 2tc

FOR SALE -  Wheat Seed 
TAM 101 -  Charles Durham, 
658-3497.______________ 9-3 tfc

THINKING ABOUT a center 
pivot irrigation system? Ask 
about our special summer 
prices on the Lindsay Zim- 
matic. Knox County 
Irrigation Service & Supply 
Corp., (817) 658-3081, 658-3072.

FOR SALE - Unused, 
b ea u tifu l b irch w o o d  
bathroom vanity and basin, 
22x30, 658-3059. 9-17 tfc

RUST AND corrosion 
problems? See the Grundfos 
stainless steel submersible 
pumps for domestic and 
irrigation wells. Knox Coun­
ty Irrigation Service & Sup­
ply Corp., (817) 658-3081, 658- 
3072. 5-7 tfc

NO GIMMICK! Guaranteed 
to save you money on every 
fill-up. RAMJET, U.S. paten­
ted fuel saver is guaranteed 
to give you better gas 
mileage or your money is 
refunded. Installs in minutes 
-  without tools. $19.95. Buddy 
Angle, (817) 658-3142 or 658-
3327. 5-28 tfc

REALTOR*

DAVID COUNTS
INSURANCE AND REAL ESTATE 

102 N. Ave. A •• Knox City 
(817) 658-3211

FOR SALE “  Studio Couch 
with matching chair, six tube 
leg chairs. See at 401 South
Second. 9-17 tfc

► REAL ESTATE REAL ESTATE 0 TOO LATE 
TO CLASSIFY (

207 ACRES - Two irrigation 
wells, gravity flow irrigation. 
One mile west of O’Brien on 
FM 2229 See Vaughn Brooks. 
817-658-3363 7-2 tfc

FOR SALE By Owner -  
Three bedroom, one bath 
home. Approximately one 
year old. Builtinjdishwasherj 
fully carpeted. 
proximately 1200 square feet. 
903 Aspen. Call (817) 658-3998 
after 4:00. 9-3 tfc
HOUSE FOR SALE By 
Owner -  On three lots, stucccr 
house, three bedrooms, two 
full baths, living room, dining 
room, den, kitchen (built in 
appliances), utility area,

‘ refrigerated air units, 
basement, garage, shop 
house. Across from Baptist 
(3iurch, 205 Central. Call Sue 
Clayton at 658-3251. Shown by 
appointment. 6-18 tf<

FOR SALE By Owner - New 
home, near completion. Call 
berrell Marion 658-3665 for 
details. 7-30 tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE ~ OiUer 
home, two bedroom, central 
air and heat. Call (817) 454- 
3921 after 5. 9-17 2tc

FOR SALE BY OWNER -  
Restored three bedroom 
home, adorably decorated. 
411 Fast Main, 658-3838. 
$27,000. 9-3 tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE ~ In Ben 
jamin -1500 square feet, four 
bedrooms, two baths, to be 
remodeled. Make an offer. 
Call 454-2541. 7-23 tfc

FOR SALE In Benjamin -  
New house on four lots, 1288 
sq. ft., three bedroom, two 
bath. Call (817) 454-3191 after 
5:00 p.m. 9-17 tfc

BOY’S JEANS for sale - 5 
pair Sears Toughskins size 16 
slim, like new. Call 658-3815.

NOW IN STOCK The All New- 
EraserMate 2. Only 98 cents. 
The Knox County news.

FOR SALE ~ Rye seed, some 
cleaned and treated. Other 
in bulk. Lewis Hester, 
Rochester, 743-3263. 8-27 4tp

SEE OUR New Colors in 
Eldon stackable letter trays. 
Create a beautiful new color 
scheme for your office today. 
The Knox County News.

8-13 tfc

►
AUTOS, TRUCKS 

TRAILERS

FOR SALE - Pontiac station 
wagon Grand Safari (817) 
422-4868. 9-10 2tp

FOR SALE - Extra clean 1979 
Mercury Marquis, four door 
hard top. New tires, excellent 
condition. Call (817) 464-3551 
after 5:00 p.m. 8-13 tfc

►
WANTED

Bwr

(
WANTED -  Babysitter 
IV2 .vear old Saturday after­
noon m your home. Referen-r 
ces required. Call 658-3052 af­
ter 6:00p.m. 9-17 tfc

WANTED -  Concrete work of 
any kind, also carpenter 
work. Call 817 743-3497 or 817 
743-3224. 9-10 4tp

Margaret’s
802 EAST MAIN

Weekend Specials
Good Thors. -  Fri. -  Sat.

We reserve the right to Kmit

SIX PACK C Q

DR. PEPPER i.oz ca„^l^^
UPTON’S 2 OZ. JAR 0 ^  { T Q

INSTANT TEA
FOLGER’S 1 Lb.CAN Q 9

COFFEE  most all grinds -iiL

YAMS Lb 3 9 ^
OUR DARLING CREAM STYLE A  / O C k ^

CORN.......1 7 0 Z .C A N I ^ /  O l/
Pork Chops, T-Bones, Rib-Eye Steaks 

Carl’s Pork Sausage 
Club Steaks and Cured Hams

KIDDIELAND, Licensed 
Day Care Center, 206 South 
Second (west). Monday 
through Friday, 7 to 5. Call in 
advance 658-3055. 7-16

PIPELINES - a n y  si^e, for 
any purpose. Fast, expei*t ki: 
stallation. See the folk at 
Knox County Irrigation Ser­
vice & Supply Corp,, (817) 
658-3081,658-3072.

BAYLOR MILLING CO.. 
Throckm orton Highway^, 
Seymour. Custom mixing- 
pelleting - your grain or ours. 
Range cubes, creep feeds, 
hog feeds, start to finish. 888- 
3921. tfc

CUSTOM TRENCHING - Nd 
job too long or too short. 4 in­
ches to 12 inches wide: how 
deep do you want it? Knox 
County Irrigation Service & 
Supply Corp., (817) 658-3081, 
658-3072. 5-7 tfc

WATER WELL Drilling:
House, Stock Irrigation 
Wells, Test Holes, Call W.P. 
Hise (817) 864-3727, Haskell, 
Texas (day or night). 2-15 tfc

CUSTOM FARMING apd 
welding, Ed Daniel, 658-3196.

►CARD OF THANKS

I would like to take this op­
portunity to say, “ thank you’ ’ 
to all the wonderful people in 
Knox City and O’Brien for 
their comforting words and 
deeds, for lifting our names 
up in prayer when we needed 
it most, for helping Connie 
and her four boys get through 
some trying times during her 
divorce and getting settled 
again.

Thanks to Joe Reeder for 
good legal counsel.

To Ronnie, Lillian Ray and 
Matt: If I caused any anger, 
grief, or bitterness in your 
lives, I want to say, I am 
sorry. May God touch your 
lives with His loving hand is 
my prayer.

Knox City, O’Brien is a 
wonderful place to live. We 
love you all.

Wayne McKinney

The Knox County Hospital 
Auxiliary would like to thank 
C.E. Williams and 
Cablevision for the in­
stallation of televisions at the 
auxiliary thrift shop. 9-17 Itc

CARD OF THANKS 
Dear Friends,

Words cannot express the 
gratitude we feel for all you 
did for us at the loss of our 
precious Jodie.

We just want to say thank 
you for all the flowers, cards, 
donations and most 
especially for your prayers.

The love and concern you 
have shown us will always be 
remembered. God bless all of 
you.

Jim & Judy Mitchell 
& Shane

Payton & Mandy Tankersley 
Mr. & Mrs. E.H. Tankersley 

Mr. & Mrs. Willie Carrington 
9-17 Itc

NOTE OF APPRECIATION 
We would like to recom­

mend The Cotton Patch Cafe 
in Knox City for any type of 
special occasion such as 
rehearsal dinners and other 
catered affairs.

The rehearsal dinner for 
the Burkham-Covey wedding 
was excellent and the service 
was unsurpassed.

Eva & L.A. Covey

CARD OF THANKS 
We want to express our 

deepest appreciation for your 
generous gift in honor of our 
precious son, William Ross 
Seay.

The thoughtfulness of our 
long time friend has helped 
us so much in our sorrow.

Thank you again, 
Allene & Buster 

9-17 Itp

Simpson 
Electronics

TV & stereo Repair 
10 Avenue D 

Haskell

Bobby Simpson 
(817)864-3111

An election for a director to 
serve in Zone 3 on the Wichita 
Brazos Soil and Water Con­
servation District Board is 
scheduled for Tuesday, Oc­
tober 6, 1981 at the Farmers 
Grain Co. in Knox City. The 
election will be held at 9:30 
a.m.

State law decrees that to be 
eligible to vote in a soil and 
water conservation district 
directors election, a person 
must own agricultural land 
within the subdivision where 
the election is being held. The 
person must also live in a 
county, all or any part of 
which is in the district and the 
voter must be at least 18 
years old.

Legal qualifications state 
that a candidate for the office 
of a soil and water conser­
vation district director must 
own land in the zone he 
represents, be at least 18 
years of age, and be actively 
engaged in farming or ran­
ching. He must also live m a 
county, all or part of which is 
in the district.

Zone 3 of the district in­
cludes an area from a line 
beginning at a point where 
the Brazos River intersects 
Farm to Market road 267, 
thence south along FM road 
267 to its intersection with FM 
road 2534, thence south­
westerly along FM road 2534 
to its intersection with fm

road 3202 and thence south 1t 
its intersection with FM road 
1043, thence southwest along 
FM road 1043 to its intersec­
tion with State Highway 222, 
thence in a southwesterly 
direction along State High­
way 222 to its intersection 
with FM road 2365, thence 
southeast along FM road 2365 
to its intersection with FM 
road 2229, thence south on FM 
road 2229 to its intersection 
with Knox and Haskell Coun­
ty line, thence west along 
Knox County line to the 
southwest corner of Knox 
County, thence in a northerly 
direction along Knox and 
King County line to its inter­
section with the Brazos 
River, thence in a nor­
theasterly direction along 
Brazos River to its intersec­
tion with FM road 267 which 
is the point of beginning.
9-10 2tc

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 
Knox County Com­

missioners Court will accept 
sealed bids until 9:00 a.m. on 
October 12 for equipment and 
training necessary to operate 
an Emergency Response 
System consisting of in­
dividual in home units and a 
central station. All bids must 
be submitted in sealed en­
velopes marked Emergency 
Response System, addressed 

See Legal Notices 
________ Page Three

arnold insurance 
and real estate

(817)658-3509

FOR SALE: Beautiful 4 room house & bath, on 2 acres. 
Sunset Area, on pavement. Water, Butane, TV Anten­
na, Garage. House completely refurbished, and other 
features. Owner financing on part of sale price to 
reliable parties.

ALSO has Ford late model tractor & equipment, for 
sale. Reasonably priced.

FOR SALE: Knox City, two story, beautiful comer lot, 
on S. 4th St. Priced below value.

TWO BEDROOM & Bath on Ave. A North Third, Very 
nice and priced to sell.

KNOX CITY - 3 B/R & Bath. 504 N. 2nd St., very nice, 
priced $12,500. Owner will carry part of sale price to 
reliable purchaser. All furniture goes with sale. Fur­
niture very nice.

COME BY OR c a l l . WE KEEP THEM MOVING.

Barney Arnold 
Pat Anderson

Barney B. Arnold 
Esther Conn

ALL SAVERS 
CERTIFICATES

TAX
Starting October 1,1981, you may purchase 
a one-year certificate of deposit with up to

$2,000.00 Tax Exempt Interest
for married coupies fiiing jointiy.

Your present 6-month Money Market 
CD’s can be converted to this new 
certificate withoutpenaity.

Caii or con 9 by for detaiis as 
theyapp'y oyou.

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK

Phone 817-658-3527 
KNOX CITY, TEXAS



► LEGAL NOTICE O NOTICES

F r o m  P a g e  T w o
to Commissioners Court, Box 
77, Benjamin, Texas 79505.

Bid specifications may be 
obtained in the office of Coun­
ty Judge.

The Knox County Com­
missioners Court reserves 
the right to reject any or all 
bids and award the bid con­
sidered most advantageous to 
the County. 2tc

LEGAL NOTICE
The Benjamin ISD is 

seeking bids on the sale of all 
of Lot No.l in Block 41 of the 
original town of Benjamin in 
Knox County, Texas.

Any details concerning this 
land may be obtained from 
the superintendent’s office. 
Bids will be opened at the 
Board meeting room on Oc­
tober 5,1981, at 8:00 p.m. The 
Board reserves the right to 
reject any and all bids.

LaMoyne Patterson 
President, Benjamin ISD 

9-10 2tc School Board

LEGAL NOTICE 
THAT IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF' 
THE PENAL CODE TEXAS 
CRIMINAL TRESPASS 
(SENATE BILL HI PASSED 
BY THE 62nd 
LEGISLATURE), NOTICE 
IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT 
ALL LANDS OF W.T. 
WAGGONER ESTATE ARE 
POSTED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION IS 
GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

CHARLES M. PRATHER 
tfc TRUSTEE

HASKELL M EM ORIAL 
Hospital needs LVNs, all 
three shifts. Differential pay 
3-11, 11-7, good benefits. 
Philip Martin, Director of 
Nurses, 817-864-2621. 8-27 4tc

O’Brien Happenings
By AUDIE JOHNSTON

GARAGESALE i

►

GARAGE SALE ~ Saturday, 
September 19, ONLY! Couch, 
rocker chair and two end 
tables, coffee table. Lots of 
other items! 1201 South 
Third. 9-17 Itp

GARAGE SALE - One door 
south of Baptist Church. 
Thursday and Friday. Two 
large stereo speakers, sheets, 
children’s clothes. 9-17 Itc

GARAGE SALE - 611 South 
4th Street, Friday and Satur­
day, 9 to 6. Baby, Children & 
Adidt Clothes, TV set, pool 
table, 8-track tapes and small 
appliances. 9-17 Itp

PROTECTING 
YOUR FAMILY^

No place is absolute­
ly safe from lightning, but 
being in an enclosed car 
is your best safety bet, ac­
cording to an expert with 
the National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration 
( N O A A ) .

Richard E. Hallgren, di­
rector o f  n o a a ’s National, 
Weather Service, exp la ins 
that lightning striking an en­
closed car usually travels 
along the outer metal skin 
o f  the vehicle and then 
jumps to the ground.

HERE AND THERE 
Mr. aiid Mrs. David Hunt 

and Amy of Midland spent the 
weekend with their parents 
Mr. and Mrs. E.W. Hunt and 
Mr. and Mrs. L.A. Covey, 
Ava and John and attended 
the wedding of Greg Covey 
and Gaylynn Burkham.

Mr. and Mrs. Ross 
Walsworth and Jill Bennett 
and children of Albany spent 
some time at their home here 
Labor Day.

Randy York and a friend 
John of Toledo, Ohio, spent 
several days last week with 
his grandmother, Annah

Beware Of Fraudulent 
Phone Solicitations

NOTICES

NOW EN RO LLIN G  
STUDENTS for music theory 
and keyboard. Call Zoanne 
Felts, 658-3066 after 6:00 
p.m. 8-27 tfc

LICENSED COMMERCIAL 
radio technician, FCC an­
nuals alarm check outs, two 
way radio service. Call Russ 
Hays, 658-3082.___________ 9-3 4tp

NOTICE -  I will not be 
responsible for any debts 
made by any person other 
than myself. Melville J. 
Rister. 9-3 4tp

ART-CRAFT Show and Sale, 
Saturday, September 19, 9:00 
a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Come do 
some early Christmas shop­
ping, east side of square. Cot­
tage Inn Building, Munday. 
Interested participants con­
tact Happiness Is 
Homemade, 422-4027. 9-10 2tc

A n  e n c lo s e d  car is th e  
safest place t o  b e  w h e n  
lig h tn in g 's  in  th e  a ir .

It’s not the car’s rubber 
tires that insulate you from 
the lightning, but the vehi­
cle’s metal shell, which di­
verts the lightning’s killing 
amperage.

The N O A A  offers these 
lightning safety tips:

• Go indoors or get into 
an enclosed car, but not a 
convertible.

• If you must remain 
outside, stay away from 
metal pipes, wire clothes­
lines, fences, metal sports 
equipment, tractors and all 
metal farm equipment.

• If you ’re swimming or 
boating, get out o f  and 
away from the water. In 
wooded areas, keep away 
from trees or small sheds 
that stand alone.

F ort W o rth ...W .R . 
Newsome, Postal Inspector 
in Charge, announced that 
INTERPOL-CANADA has in­
formed the Postal Inspection 
Service that various 
Canadian companies are 
soliciting sales by telephone 
to businesses in the United 
States using sales pitches 
which may constitute fraud 
r e p r e s e n ta t io n s : The
Canadian companies usually 
offer advertisement items 
such as pens, key chains, and 
lighters on which business 
names and phone numbers 
are printed.

The salesmen, who work 
out of “ boiler-room” type 
operations, describe the 
products as being Shaeffer- 
type pens and Zippo-type 
lighters, and many offer free 
trips to Las Vegas, Miami, or 
Cuba, or free Kodak-type 
cameras, as extra incentives 
to customers to buy the mer­
chandise. Newsome said the 
products are very poor 
quality and are not manufac­
tured by the name brand 
companies. The free trips do 
not include transportation 
and consists only of discount 
coupons for accom ­
modations, meals, enter­
tainment, etc. The promoting 
companies send the shipmen­
ts C.O.D. so victims cannot

examine the contents prior to 
paying for them. These com­
panies have been known to 
change their trade names af­
ter a period of time, so 
N ew som e ca u tio n e d
businesses to be alert to 
solicitations of this type and 
to request callers to send 
written offers describing 
their merchandise.

Businesses which believe 
they have been victimized by 
s im ila r  te lep h on e
solicitations should refer 
them to the Postal Inspector 
in Charge, ATTN: Fraud, 
P.O. Box 1230, Fort Worth, 
TX 76101-8004.

TOWER
DRIVE-IN

RULE, TEXAS 
Box O ffic* Opens 8:00 

Show Starts 9:00

FRI.-SAT.-SUN.
Sept. 18-19-20

TARZAN
THE

APE MAN
RATEDR

Happy
Birthday

Lou!
From Your 
Favorite 
Bunch!

W hy gas is plentiful:

50% of the Gas
There are thousands of square miles of 
natural gas formations in these nine ba­
sins. Industry experts estimate that 
these basins hold 50% of the nation’s 
remaining onshore reserves. Lone

Star’s pipeline system extends to eight 
of them, which should give you a nice 
warm feeling for many a long winter. It’s 
another reason to be glad you’re served 
by the Lone Star system.

Gas. It’s plentiful, efficient and right for the times.

Lone S tar Gas Com pany

Johnston.
Those attending the Bible 

Conference at the Elmcrest 
Baptist Church in Abilene 
this last week were Demp and 
Mamie Emerson, Bernice 
Rowan, Bill and Evelyn 
Trice, Craig Brothers, 
Jonathan, Joe and Dan (Jod- 
sey, and Charles, Faye and 
Kevin Reed. Jack Taylor and 
Peter Lord were the 
preachers.

Zollie Thomas who has 
been a patient in the Brazos 
Valley Care Home for several 
months returned to his home 
here and his daughter, Em­
ma Jean Penick of Fort 
Worth is visiting him.

Teresa Denson and son of 
Stamford visited her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Buster Hodges, 
Sunday.

Clifton Duncan was in 
Wichita Falls Monday for a 
checkup after back surgery 
several weeks ago.

Mr. and Mrs. Demp Emer­
son were in Anson Sunday to 
attend the 50th wedding an­
niversary of Demp’s brother. 
Jack Emerson and wife.

The Knox 
County News
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NOTICE - Any erroneous reflection 
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Texas 79529.

Options
Offered

SAN ANGELO -  General 
Telephone now gives its 
customers three options on 
what to do with their 
telephones when having ser­
vice discontinued.

The Public Utility Com­
mission of Texas, in its rate 
order granting General 
Telephone $2.1 million, ap­
proved a policy which gives 
customers the options of 
paying a charge for the com­
pany to pick up the in­
struments, retaining the in­
struments and paying the 
associated costs for the in­
struments retained, or retur­
ning the phones to the com­
pany.

Customers terminating 
service who return their 
phones to their telephone 
company business office or 
GTE Phone Mart are not 
charged a pick-up fee. 
However, if the company 
picks up the instruments, a
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office or GTE Phone Mart. .$10 charge is applied for 
residential customers and $13 
for business one-party 
customers. Another option is 
for the customer to purchase 
the phones, paying the com­
mission-approved charges 
for particular instruments. 
Under this option the in­
struments become the 
property of the customer. A 
schedule of rates for par­
ticular instruments is 
available from the business

The new policy applies to 
all residential customers and 
on e -p a rty  b u sin ess  
customers.

Customers who return or 
retain their phones can un­
plug the instruments if they 
have GTE Phone Mart jacks, 
or if wired into the old style 
wall block, can simply cut the 
wires near the block.

Beautiful 
Beginnings

Weddings in Siik
^ By the Flower Lady

FOR APPOINTMENT CALL
8 1 7 -6 5 8 -3 3 0 3  ( _ > .

ClUiAteRdeH AVIATION. INC.

Munday Airport 
422-4536

'Providing A Service' 
HELICOPTER -  FIXED WING  

Spraying - Seeding 
Predator Control 
Cattle Roundup 
Field Checking ______

Knox City Airport 
658-3716

T-BONE
SPECIAL!

Thursday Night After 5:00

$575
Includes Baked Potato, Salad Bar, 

and Choice of Tea or Coffee

THE COTTON PATCH CAFE
711 East Main 817-658-3754

MORTON'S SALISBURY STEAK/TURKEY WESTERN/MEATLOAF
11 oz.DINNERS Vk̂

GLADIOLA

FLOUR 'eii'G
UPTON FAMILY SIZE

TEA DAGS PKG.
SWIFT PREMIUM

Vienna Sausage

$ - | 2 9

S I

RITZ <
CRACKERS V I- ^

> 1 2 9

DORDEN'S FRUIT

DRINK 1 GAL

SUNSHINE COOKIES i
CHIP-A-ROO'S m: ^

; 1 2 9

SHURFINE K '
1 2 9SUGAR sus ^
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News Notes 
from the

Brazos Valley Care Home
BYRENATANKERSLEY

M l
Sunday School, September 

13, taught by Ozelle Stephens. 
The lesson was on 2nd Corn. 
Peggy Guinn played the 
piano. Lacy Headrick was 
present to help with the music 
and singing, 17 were present.

Sunday afternoon Church 
Services were Conducted by 
the First Baptist Church of 
Benjamin with Rev. Clyde 
McCullough bringing the 
message on disobedience. 
Linda Griffith played the 
piano, 25 were present.

Tuesday, September 8, 
Bingo winners were Mrs. 
Bradford, Mrs. Williamson, 
Eda Faye Pounds, Hallie 
Barrington, Zona Guffey, 
Waynell Clark, Mrs. Dabney 
and Mr. Strickland.

Blackout winners were 
Weeper Aldridge and Mrs. 
Che^ie Jackson.

September 11, Bingo Win­
ners were Eda Faye Pounds 
1, Lena Dabney 2, Hazel 
Clark 2, Dicie Singleton 1, 
Hallie Barrington 1, and Mrs. 
O’Pry. Blackout winners 
were Dicie Singleton, Eda 
Faye Pounds, and Hazel 
Qark.

Mr. and Mrs. Pate Meinzer 
from Benjamin visited the 
Brazos Valley Care Home 
Sunday afternoon.

KC Garden Club 
Meets Septembers

The Knox City Garden Club 
met Tuesday, September 8, at 
the Community Center with a 
covered dish luncheon.

Invocation was given by 
Mrs. Douglas Stenberg.

Members were welcomed 
by Mrs. W.B. Hudson, the 
club’s new president.

The Pledge to the Flag was 
given and Mrs. Pete 
Williams, yearbook chair­
man, gave a report on the 
yearbook.

Hostesses for the meeting 
were Mmes. Guy Robinson, 
W.B. Hudson and L.E. 
Groves.

Those present in addition to 
those mentioned were Mmes. 
Ottis Cash, W.E. Hertel, H.F. 
Jungman, Ulric Lea, J.C. 
McGee, C.E. Reed, H.E. 
Wall, G.E. Wilson and the 
club’s new member, Mrs. 
Douglas Stenberg.

The next meeting will be 
Tuesday, October 13, at the 
Community Center at 2:00 
p.m.

HUMIDITY
Maintaining a com fort­

able level o f  humidity in 
y ou r  home m ay help you  
h o ld  down your energy 
costs.

Dry air absorbs m ore 
moisture from your skin 
than does humid air. The 
evaporation o f  body mois­
ture cools you o ff  in hot 
weather, and makes you feel 
chilly in cold weather.

That’s why a home with 
the right level o f  humidity 
will require less air condi­
tioning in the summer, and 
less heating in the winter for 
people to feel comfortable.

Electric appliances that 
add humidity to the air, hu­
midifiers, and ones which 
remove it, dehumidifiers, 
may be a wise investment.

Weldon and Jane Gideon 
and Oscar, Lana, and Sue 
Gideon visited Mrs. Gideon.

Lana Gideon, Fred Gideon, 
Aleta Welch, Dewey and 
Marie Darr, Jewel Matura, 
Pearl Gage, Romona Helms, 
Karen West and children, 
Lois Richardson, Loretta 
Albus, and Lorena Burnison 
visited Mae Flowers.

Alice White, Myrtle Leach, 
Zena and George Wall, Tess 
and Elmer Wall Jr., Oleta 
Welch, Raymond Wilhite, Vic 
Thomas, and Anne and Tom 
Matlock visited Elmer Wall.

Sandra Chambers, Bud 
Reynolds, Bill and Cindy 
Reynolds, Billy Glen Womble 
and Alwona of Red Springs 
and Mrs. Rose Warren visited 
Ruth and Wayne Harden.

Laura Benson visited Hazel 
and Waynell Clark.

Betty Aldridge, Julia 
Trepanier and Ricky and 
Kim visited Mrs. Trepanier.

Stanton and Shari Brown, 
Oleta Welch, Jessie Roberts, 
Charles and Linda Griffith, 
and Vic Thomas visited L. 
Brown.

Vannah Carmock of 
Rochester, Nena Eply of 
Rochester, Bessie Bell and 
Dave Davidson of Rochester, 
and Raymond Wilhite visited 
Eda Faye Pounds and Grace 
Cyr.

Vickie, Ember and Cody 
Josselet of Haskell visited 
Clara Lowry.

Raymond Wilhite and 
White Singers visited Lucille 
Idol.

Vannah Carmach of 
Rochester, Neva Eply of 
Rochester, Laura Benson of 
Benjamin, Judy Shipman, 
Paul Worley of Dallas, Oleta 
Welch, Larean Pape of Mon­
day and her sister Ruth from 
Oklahoma, Nancy McGregor 
of Benjamin and Jessie 
Roberts visited Zona Guffy.

Raymond Wilhite and Vic 
Thomas visited Nena Alvis.

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Johnson 
visited Abb Johnson.

Barbara and Marvin, 
Raymond Wilhite visited Ben 
Snelson. ‘

Alice White, Myrtle Leach, 
Evelyn Balls and Shelly, 
Tracy Rios, Ozella Thomas, 
Mrs. H.E. Wall, Jimmy 
O’Pry, R. Wilhite, Yolonda 
Roberts, Benjamin and Ran­
dy Roberts and Kimberly 
Bettes visited Dicie Singleton 
and Mrs. Bradford.

Alice White, Margaret Ur- 
banczyk, Betty Aldridge, 
Lillian Brothers and Geneva 
Dirwin of Fort Worth visited 
Mrs. Chessie Jackson.

Betty Aldridge, Elton 
Qualls, Mary Qualls, and 
Mrs. H.E. Wall vjsited Bertha 
Trimmer.

Kevin Strickland, Ralph 
Strickland, Clara Strickland, 
Eric Strickland, Phil 
Strickland, Betty Aldridge, 
and Nina Duncan and V.E. 
Duncan visited Weeper 
Aldridge and C.C. Strickland.

Alice White, Myrtle Leach, 
Mrs. A. Wall, Ozelle 
Stephens, Mrs. H.E. Wall, 
Modelle Barton, Thelma 
Williamson, and Mabel 
Coates visited Mrs. William­
son.

Modelle Barton visited 
Sudia Mae Ballard.

Oleta Welch and Mildred 
Tankersley visited Clyde 
Jones.

Church School 10:00
Morning Worship 11:00
Evening Worship 6:00

Doug stenberg, Pastor

FiftST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
406 S. Second Knox City,Ty»is

1

B&G
AUTO SERVICE CENTER

1003 East Main

Transmissions, Transfer Cases,

Rear Axle Assemblies, Air Conditioning 

Tuneups, Brakes, Overhauls 

All Minor and Major Repairs

Craig Brothers •• Jon Godsey 
817-658-3606

STREAMS IN 
DESERT PLACES 

By OZELLE STEPHENS

Wisdom is a tree of life who 
eat her fruits; Happy is the 
man who keeps on eating it 
(Prov. 3:18).

The Lord’s founded the ear­
th; his understanding 
established all the universe 
and space. The deep foun­
tains of the earth were broken 
up by his knowledge, and the 
skies poured down rain. ,

Man should have two goals; 
Wisdom “  that is knowledge 
and doing right and common 
sense. Don’t let them slip 
away, for they fill you with 
living energy, and are a 
feather in your cap, which 
means that you dwell safely 
in the land. They keep you 
safe from defeat and disaster 
or the plots of the wicked, for 
the Lord is with you to protect 
you.

Don’t withhold repayments 
of your debts. Don’t say, 
some other time” , if you can 
pay now. Don’t plot against 
your neighbor; he is trusting 
you...The curse of God is on 
the wicked, but his blessings 
are on the upright. (Proverbs 
3:19-33).

Be filled with the love of 
(Jod in whom are hid all the 
treasures of wisdom and 
knowledge. (Col. 2:3).

TFU Membership Drive 
Set September 21 -25
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WACO, TX -  In order to aid 
and strengthen the family 
farm system in Texas, the 
Texas Farmers Union is 
launching a statewide mem­
bership drive the week of 
September 21-25. Texas Far­
mers Union President Mike 
Moeller called on all family 
farmers and ranchers in 
Texas ‘ ‘to work together in 
protecting their livelihood 
and preserving agriculture as 
the backbone of America.” 

The Texas Farmers Union, 
now 79 years old, was founded 
in Point, Texas, in 1902 as the 
Farmers Educational and 
Cooperative Union of 
America. The TFU now has 
10,000 family members in­
volving all commodity groups 
while the National Farmers 
Union has over 250,000 mem­
bers in agricultural states.

The Farmers Union 
represents farmers and ran­
chers in legislative activities 
in both Washington, D.C. and 
Austin. The association also 
p ro v id e s  e d u ca t io n a l 
materials and promotes 
co o p e r a t io n  am ong 
producers. The TFU also is 
involved in rural develop­
ment programs which in­
clude senior citizens 
programs - Green Thumb and 
the Senior Texans Em­
ployment Program (STEP).

Among the national issues 
the Farmers Union is curren-

Boyd’s 
Welding 
Service

Backhoe Service 
Available

24 HR. SERVICE 
Sheltoh Boyd 
1^71658-3639

Salt-Meal Mixes

Commercial Creep 
Chow®

Range ChoW® 
Blocks

Grass Stretcher® 
w/Rumensin®

RALSTON PURINA 
AGENT

P.H. Pierce 
Benjamin, Texas 
(817)454-3271

I r u c k l o a d  S a le s !

RANCH-DELIVERIES

DIRECT-FROM-THE-MILL

S p e c ia l

for
Wheat-Pasture

Calves...
Get 'em started 

right.

Preconditioning/ 
Receiving Chow®

Purina. The cattleman’s company.

ARE YOU INTERESTED 
IN MAKING A FEW 

MORE BUSHELS OF 
WHEAT PER ACRE?
If So, See Us For All 

Your F ertilizer Needs
WE HAVE IN STOCK 

16-20-0-13S 16-20-6-11S
18-46-0 11-53-0-3S

32-0-0 Liquid & 10-30-4
See Us For All Your Custom Application

Liquid or Dry

Also Anhydrous Ammonia
We have plenty of applicators for 

anhydrous ammonia 
-SEEDWHEAT-

Northrup King 812, Vona, Tam 101 
-WALKEN OATS- 

One New Tender Cart Complete
(Includes Trailer, Tender Cart, 10 Horse Motor)

SPECIAL 5 5 3 0 0 0 ®

Zeissel Bros., Inc.
FERTILIZER & SEED

817-422-4606 Nights 422-4816
MONDAY. TEXAS

8 MILES EAST OF KC ON FM 2534

tly working on are the 1981 
Farm Bill, preservation of 
disaster loans, reduction of 
interest rates, maintaining 
the social security system, 
changes in estate and gift tax 
law, assistance for beginning 
farmers, protection against 
grain elevator bankruptcies 
and others.

On the state level, the 
Texas Farmers Union 
worked for the tax exemption 
for gasohol, prohibition of 
foreign purchases of 
agricultural land, reform of 
property tax laws and 
establishment of the Farm 
and Ranch security program. 
The TFU also plans to have 
introduced a bill which will 
set minimum prices for 
commodities in Texas in the 
1983 legislature.

In addition to legislative 
activities, the Farmers Union

also has group health, life and 
property insurance programs 
for the farm and family, a 
tire and battery program and 
other special membership 
services.

Persons interested in 
joining Farmers Union and 
supporting the family farm 
system may contact their 
local county Farmers Union 
president.

National 
Farmers Union u  Insurance Companies

CHARLES R. THORNHILL 
Life • Home • Business 

Blue Cross/Blue Shield

522 S. Second 
P.O. Box 121 
Haskell, TX 79521

Bus.: (817) 864-2842 
Res.: (817) 8^-3511

Knox City
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See it today!

Knox County News
658-3142

City Cleaners
announces 

NEW HOURS

7:30 -  5:00 
Monday -  Friday 
8-12 Saturday

‘if your clothes aren ’t becoming to you, 
you should be coming to us."

-  ALTERATIONS-
(One day service if needed)

WE WOULD LIKE FOR ALL 
OF OUR FRIENDS AND CUSTOMERS

To Come 
For Our Aonual 

No Money Down
U V -A -W A Y

SALE
NO MONEY DOW N-NO CARRYING CHAR6ES- 
MAKE YOUR 1ST PAYMENT WITHIN 30 DAYS

JiM B
FOR BIG KIDS 

AND THE WHOLE FAMILY

SHOP EARLY & LAYAWAY FOR CHRISTMAS

COME ON IN!!
N ow  In Progress

Knox City E V E R Y  IT EM  AN  O U T S T A N D IN G  V A L U E !

If You Want Variety 
We Have I t . . .

BankAmericard
' .  7.1

STEREO
CENTER

$ 1 2 9 5

LIGHT
BULBS
4 /$ 1 9 7

FLEX
SHAMPOO

$ 1 7 7

ALCOHOL
2 / $ 1 0 0

Lisa Mornay

Shampoo
Bath Oil

Hand Lotion
$ ] ^ 6 9

Each

18GALLON

TRASH
CAN
$ 4 9 7

... Red Hot Specials 
On Every Counter

Pampers 

$327
Daytime 30’s

Newborns
$ 2 9 7



KC School News

THE KENNEL
JUNIOR CLASS NEWS 
By Toni Hewitt

On Tuesday of last week, 
the Juniors had a hall 
decorations meeting. It was 
our turn to decorate the halls 
for the Seymour game.

The Juniors also had 
another job last Friday, we 
had the concession stand for 
the Seymour game. Mrs. 
Watson expresses her per­
sonal thanks to everyone for 
getting the items to the con­
cession stand Friday night. 
Also, a special thank you to 
the mothers who worked and 
those who stayed throught the 
whole game because they 
were so busy.

On Wednesday of this week, 
we will be takjng school pic­

tures. Juniors that will be 
taking twirling pictures are 
Kristi Boone and Karae 
Beason. Adela Rocha, Angie 
Quintana, Diane Helms, and 
Toni Hewitt will be taking 
Drill Team pictures.

SOPHOMORE CLASS NEWS 
By Sarah Jones

Does any(Hie out there know 
what the word “ sophomore” 
means? The word is made up 
of two Greek words; sophos, 
which means wise, and 
moros, which means foolish. 
So a sophomore is a wise fool. 
How’s that for confusing?

The sophomores of KCHS 
are very busy, wise fools. 
Each of them is juggling 
schoolwork and ex­

tracurricular activities like 
crazy! Going on now is 
homework, band, football, 
volleyball, and pep club. All 
the sophomores involved in 
each of these will be men­
tioned in the next few w^ks. 
We’ll start with homework 
this week. Everybody in the 
class has homework.

FHA NEWS 
By Sarah Jones 

Thursday, September 17, is 
Citizenship Day. You may be 
thinking “ What am I doing 
reading about citizenship in 
the FHA news?”  Well, the 
Future Homemakers of 
America plays a big part in 
developing its members into 
good citizens. The objective

of FHA is: to help youth 
assume their roles in society 
through Home Economics 
Education in areas of per­
sonal growth, family life, 
vocational preparation and 
community involvement.

So if you’re wondering what 
is happening to youth “ these 
days” , think about your local 
chapter of FHA, and its 
positive program for helping 
young people develop into 
good citizens.

KEY CHAPTER NEWS 
By Vera Sweat 

The FHA Key Chapter held 
a meeting to elect officers on 
September 14. President 
Missy Pierce, vice-president 
Linda Mayes, secretary 
Debra Johnson, treasurer 
Janie Casillas and reporter 
Vera Sweat. These are our 
1981-82 fresh m en
h om em ak in g  o f f i c e r s .  
CONGRATULATIONS!!!

PEP CLUB NEWS 
By Diane Helms 

Greyhounds! How do you 
feel? We feel good. Oh! We 
feel so good! Uh! So far the 
turnout for the first two 
games has been good. We all 
hope that everyone will keep

coming to the games and 
supporting our team. We 
want all the people in Knox 
City to come to Munday, 
Saturday, September 19, and 
watch our guys try to beat the 
Munday Moguls!

Get Back, Get Back, Houn­
ds don’t take no flack. We’re 
rolling down the field and 
stopping your attack!

THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS Page Five
Knox City, Texas, Thursday, September 17,1981

SCHOOL
LUNCHROOM

MENUS
BREAKFAST MENUS: 
September 21-25,1981 
Monday: Sliced Peaches, 
Cinnamon Toast, Chocolate 
Milk
Tuesday: Orange Halves, 
Muffins, Chocolate Milk 
Wednesday: Grape Juice, 
Scrambled Eggs, Buttered 
Toast and Jelly, Chocolate 
Milk
Thursday: Apple Juice,
Bacon, Buttered Toast and 
Jelly, Chocolate Milk 
Friday: Applesauce, Cin­
namon Rolls, Chocolate Milk

LUNCH MENUS:
September 21-25,1981 
Monday: _  Meat Loaf,

Scalloped Potatoes, Apple 
Halves, Cornbread and But­
ter, Milk
Tuesday: Cheese Dog
w/chili, French Fries, Can­
taloupe, Cookies, Milk 
Wednesday: Taco, Lettuce, 
Tomato, and Cheese, Whole 
Kernel Corn, Cinnamon 
Rolls, Milk
Thursday: Bologna and
Cheese Sandwiches, Baked 
Beans, Crisp Carrot Sticks, 
Peach Cobbler, Milk 
Friday: Ham, Gravy, Whip­
ped Potatoes, Seasoned Peas, 
Hot Rolls, Butter and Honey, 
Milk

^ W e d d in g  J  
S ta tio n e ry

by McPhersons
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Before it’s freezing, 
Conoco Antifreeze.
Protect your car's 
cooling system 
against freeze-ups, 
boilovers, rust and 
corrosion.

Get Conoco 
Antifreeze. Nothing 
protects better.

» 2 4 9 0  case

Prices Good Thru Sept. 30

PENMAN CONOCO SERVICE, INC.
-HAYKHMAN-

609E. Main 817-658-3513

KNOX CITY GREYHOUNDS

NO. NAME POS. WT.

10 Dwayne Watkins QB 160
12 Tyke Meinzer QB 150
20 Ricky Gutierrez B 145
22 Steve Lynn B 150
24 Sammy Johnson B 130
28 Wayne Hutchinson E 155
32 Kelley Cowart F 140
35 James Stafford B 185
41 David Flores F 125
44 Glenn Hedgecoke B 165
51 James Evatt C 180
55 Richard Daniel G 225
60 Joe Rocha G 150
61 Todd Lewis C 215
62 Jeff Reece G 140
64 Lupe Rios G 170
65 Teddy Espinosa G 145
68 Kevin Eaton G 150
70 Paul Taylor G 170
72 Daniel Godsey T 175
7A Chad Whitley T 160
75 Craig Watson T 150
77 Sergio Marin T 220
80 Kevin Leach E 145
81 Chris Whitaker E 150
82 Mike Oliver E 160
84 Rob Sutton E 165
86 Rodney Dever E 175
88 Ranee Hacker F 150

PAUL TAYLOR
...senior guard

FOOTBALL 
SCHEDULE  

For Knox City Greyhounds

RICHARD DANIEL
...senior guard

SERGIO MARIN
...senior tackle

TODD LEWIS
...senior center

Sept. 4 Hawley T, 8:00 p.m.
Sept. 11 Seymour H, 8:00 p.m.
Sept. 19 Munday T,8:00 p.m.
Sept. 25 Open

DISTRICT GAMES

Oct. 2 Chillicothe H, 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 9 Jayton T, 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 16 Throckmorton H, 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 23 Aspermont H, 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 30 Newcastle T, 7:30 p.m.
Nov. 6 Rochester H, 7:30 p.m.
Nov. 13 Rule T, 7:30 p.m.

Junior Varsity Bullies

Sept. 3 Hawiey H, 7:00 p.m.
Sept. 10 Seymour T, 7:30 p.m.
Sept. 17 Munday H, 7:30 p.m.
Sept. 24 Jayton H, 7:00 p.m.
Oct. 1 Haskell H, 7:00 p.m.
Oct. 8 Munday T, 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 15 Aspermont H, 7:00 p.m.
Oct. 22 Haskell T, 7:30 p.m.
Nov. 5 Aspermont T, 7:00 p.m.

COACHES: Jimmy Rogers, Tommy Sloan, Tony Daniel, 
Ysidro Felan

MANAGER: Dell Guinn, Ted Felts 
COLORS: Red and Blue

HOUNDS Vs. MOGULS 
Saturday, September 19, There

CHEERLEADERS: Mindy Hutchinson, Michelle
Bateman, Patti Durham, Missy Pierce 

DRUM MAJOR: Melissa Whitley 
MAJORETTES: Kristi Boone, Karae Beason,

Peggi Lee Wupperman, Nancy Jones 
DRILL TEAM; Diane Helms, Toni Hewitt,

Daveine Holcomb, Amber Berryman,
Angie Quintana, Angie Norton 
Adella Rocha, Tonya Averitt 

SUPERINTENDENT: W.R. Baker 
PRINCIPALS; Bill Holcomb, Charles Reed

“M” SYSTEM
S&H GREEN STAMPS 
DON RAILSBACK, Mgr. 

658-3715

LEWIS
PAINT & BODY SHOP

Sterling, Danny, Troy, Todd 
658-3342

THE FOLLOWING MERCHANTS SPONSOR THIS AD 
AND ASK FOR YOUR SUPPORT FOR THE ‘HOUNDS

ROLLING PLAINS 
WELL SERVICE INC.

Knox City, Texas 
817-658-3990

CITIZENS STATE BANK
Insured to $100,000 

Member F.D.I.C.

arnold insurance 
and

real estate
658-3509

JONES PHARMACY
Henry J. Jones - Don Bunton 

658-3215

KUEHLER 
LUMBER & SUPPLY

True Value Dealer 
658-3416

KMA WELL SERVICE, INC.
Knox City and Wichita Falls 

658-3529

MARGARET’S 
HOME GROCERY

Margaret & E.J. Ward

AWALT AUTO SERVICE
Knox City 
658-3429

JERRY’S PLUMBING
Jerry & Peggy Guinn 

658-3322

FARMERS GRAIN CO.
Charlie Groves, Mgr. 

658-3642

LOWREY’S
The Henry L. Whites 

658-3230

PENMAN CONOCO 
SERVICE, INC.

658-3513

CHRISTENSEN AVIATION
J. M. Christensen 

658-3716

WHITE AUTO STORE
Frances & Tommy Kent 

658-3133

BOBBY‘S
OIL FIELD SERVICE

Bobby Vasquez 
658-3863

MARION
CONOCO STATION

658-3424

C&R ELECTRIC
Willie Collins-Billy Bob Reynolds 

658-3921

FAMILY BOUTIQUE
Estelle Hawkins 

658-3262

CLONTS
HARDWARE &FURN.

658-3113

LYNN ELECTRIC
The Jimmy Lynns 

658-3511

EGENBACHER
IMPLEMENT

The John Egenbachers 
658-3242

SMITH
FUNERAL HOME

658-3251

CITY CLEANERS
Ken & Lorene Bradford 

658-3641

KNOX CITY FLORIST
Joe and Barbara Barnard 

658-3581

RUSHING REPAIRS
Marie, Chock, & James 

658-3441

WAYNE’S
66 SERVICE STATION

The Wayne Watsons 
658-3814

CITY HARDWARE
The Lawsons 

658-3222

GUINN SHEET METAL 
& PLUMBING

Heat & Air Conditioning 
658-3341 L.C. and Amerolis

CABLEVISION 
OF KNOX CITY

FOR TV VIEWING AT ITS BEST 
658-3613

O’BRIEN CO-OP GIN
Randel Ledbetter, Mgr. 

658-3631

BRIDGES OIL CO.
WHOLESALE & RETAIL 
Fina Petroleum Products 

658-3875

O’BRIEN FOOD STORE
The Coy Hewitts 

817-658-3951

NORMA’S
LEATHER EXPRESS

Norma & Gene Sutton 
658-3231

SPEEDY’S
OIL FIELD SERVICE, INC.

Transport Trucks ■ Hot Oiler 
658-3751

SKILES
EXXON STATION

658-3122

KNOX CITY GRAIN
Billy Mitchell, Mgr. 

658-3712

KNOX COUNTY 
FERTILIZER

The Herbert Bellinghausens 
658-3817

COTTON PATCH CAFE
Vic & Sandy Edwards 

658-3754

TORTILLA FLAT
The Tony Rochas 

658-3460

KNOX COUNTY 
IRRIGATION

SERVICE & SUPPLY CORP.
658-3081

PUMPERS SUPPLY 
& EQUIPMENT

Terry Carter Donnie Bowles 
817-658-3260 817-997-2361

KNOX COUNTY 
FARM BUREAU

Don Welch - Larry Conner
Insurance Agents 

817-422-4555

THE LADY BUG SHOPPE 
LI’L BUG SHOPPE 
THE ART STALL

6S8-39S7

JANIE’S BARBERSHOP
Janie Wilkinson

Barber & Hair Styling 
Closed Mondays

1 PENMAN PROPANEJNC.
1 Bill Penman 
1 O’Brien-Rochester 
1 817-658-3321

COVEY’S GARAGE
IMPORT AUTO SERVICE 

658-3631 O’Brien

OWENS AUTO SUPPLY
658-3323

KNOX COUNTY NEWS
The Buddy Angles 

658-3142

LARSON’S PHARMACY
The Larry Staggs 

658-3210

SWEETWATER 
PUMP & SUPPLY INC.

Knox City



Page Six THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS
Knox City, Texas, Thursday, September 17,1981

Benjamin News
By GLADENE GREEN

Last week, being a holiday 
week, I failed to get in any 
news, thus being two weeks 
late with an apology to a 
junior high cheerleader. In 
listing the cheerleaders, two 
weeks ago I erronously left 
out Stacia Ryder. She is one 
of the junior high yell-leaders 
and a good one. I apologize for 
leaving her name out. Also 
Lori Rolston is the alternate. 
Lori and Stacia, I’m sorry. 
SCHOOL NEWS

The freshman class officers 
for the 1981-82 year are 
president Kris McGreger; 
vice president Steve White; 
treasurer Kim Trepanier; 
and secretary Glen Heard. 
Sponsor is Belle Goill.

On September 9, the fifth 
and sixth grade class elected 
officers. President is Jeff 
Pierce, vice-president Buster 
Redwine, secretary Lori 
Rolston, and treasurer Car­
men Estrada. Ann Clonts is 
class sponsor.

■^e Benjamin FHA Chap­
ter met September 1 to elect 
officers, liiey are president 
Kim Conner, secretary- 
treasurer Michelle Bufkin, 
program Lauren Reed, En­
counter Laura Reed, 
recreation Susan Cartwright, 
historian Toni Benson, and 
reporter Debbie Bufkin.

The chapter decided to 
collect aluminum cans for the 
“ March of Dimes”  during 
September. There are boxes 
for these cans at the business 
places in town, also at the 
post office. If anyone would 
like to donate these cans, con­
tact Beverly Tolson, Susan 
Cartwright, or Debbie 
Bufkin. The chapter would 
appreciate your support.
PTO PICNIC

The annual PTO picnic was 
held September 3 in the 
memorial building. Each

family brought a covered 
dish and everyone enjoyed an 
evening of fellowship and lots 
of good food. A business 
meeting followed. The main 
business was the announ­
cement of the committees of 
the Halloween Carival which 
will be held Ocotber 31 at 6:00 
p.m. in the gym.

Committees are as follows:
Coronation Committee: 

Barbara Pratt, Doris Bufkin, 
Louise Hertel, Julia Waldron.

Stage Decoration Commit­
tee: Gay Spinks-chairman, 
Karen Patterson, Susan 
Jones, Pam Duke.

Cake Walk Committee: Jan 
Pollock-chairman, Sue Ox­
ford, Ruth Redder, Reyes 
Barrientez, Dickie Propps, 
Beth Pierce, LaNay Cash, 
Judy Conner.

Door Committee: Von Con­
ner, Barbara Pierce, Kathie 
Waldron.

Bingo Committee: Lula 
and Louis Baty-chairmen, Jo 
and Loyd Heard, Jimmie and 
Donnie Ryder, Janice and 
Buddy Tolson, Jan and 
Homer Rolston, Jane and 
Weldon Gideon, Darlene and 
Slick Benson.

Food Booth Committee: 
Linda Griffith-chairm an, 
Shirley Brown, Kay Lindsey, 
Donna Westmorland, Myra 
Nell Busby, Mary Tom 
Bohannon, Lois Golden, 
Susan White, Joy Jones, 
Sheryll Simmons, Vickie 
Lyles.
RETURN FROM TRIP

Julia Propps, accompanied 
by Mabel Moorhouse of 
Amarillo returned home 
recently from a vacation 
through New Mexico and 
Colorado. They visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Price, Lisa 
and Sheryl in Brush, 
Colorado. Then went to Los 
Alamas, New Mexico and

visited Mr. and Mrs. Lonny 
Morgan and Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve Watkins. They went 
then to Albuquerque for a 
visit with the O.D. Propps. 
They were joined there by the 
Morgans and the Watkins, 
where they all enjoyed the 
Annual Chili Pepper Roast. 
They reported a wonderful 
two weeks.
HERE AND THERE

Labor Day weekend guests 
of the Bobby Robersons were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Frank 
Feemster and family of 
Brownwood.

Visitors of the Van Greens 
during Labor Day were Diane 
Green and Ruby Wynn of 
Munday, Gordon and Debbie 
Taylor, and Becky and Cody 
Stamps of Paducah.

Visiting Lil Moorhouse 
recently were Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Morris of Fort Worth.

Mr. and Mrs. C.B. Clower 
visited in Midland recently 
and attended the wedding of a 
grandson, Steve Powers 
while there.

Scotty Hertel of Wichita 
Falls was a weekend guest of 
his parents, the Don Hertels.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Lindsey 
and Mitzi were in Abilene 
Saturday.

Mickey Smith, student at 
Western Texas College in 
Snyder, was a weekend

visitor of her parents, the 
Vernon Smiths.

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon 
Gideon and children spent the 
weekend in Poolville.

Lora Hall is spending a few 
days in Plainview.
OFF TO COLLEGE 

The following Benjamin 
youth are in college this 
semester. Craig Hertel, Ed­
die Romo, Mark Oxford, 
Steve Bisbee, Midwestern 
State University; Shannon 
Ryder, Stacy Groves, Mary 
Barrientez, Sheila Benson, 
Vernon Regional Jr. College; 
Debbie Lindsey, Jessie 
Estrada, Mickey Smith, 
Western Texas College at 
Snyder; Michael Golden, 
TSTI, Sweetwater.

Also Gilliland residents, 
Benjamin graduates are in 
college - Becky Welch at VR- 
JC, and John Mark Kin- 
nibrugh and Louis Baty at 
Midwestern.
FFA NEWS 
By Ancel Redder 

Tuesday, September 15, we 
went to the Abilene Fair. We 
spent the afternoon there.

This week we will re-wire 
the Ag Shop. Last week, we 
stayed in the classroom and 
talked about livestock 
production. Ag II has been 
doing shop demonstration on 
power tools. Ag I has been 
learning about FFA and 
keeping their record books.

We plan a hayride for 
Thursday, September 18, at 
the Benjamin Lake.

. s tx > c k V i« < s ^
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PUBLIC NOTICE
BRIEF EXPLANATORY STATEMENTS 

OF PROPOSED

CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENTS
SPECIAL ELECTION 
NOVEMBER 3. 1981

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
ON THE BALLOT
Senate Joint Resolution

8 proposes a constitution­
al amendment that would 
allow the legislature to 
authorize cities, towns 
and other taxing units to 
grant exemptions from ad 
valorem taxes on an un­
productive, underdevel­
oped or blighted area in 
order to encourage its de­
velopment. The amend­
ment would also allow the 
legislature to authorize a 
city or town to issue 
bonds or notes to finance 
this development and to 
pledge future increases in 
ad valorem tax revenues 
from the property in such 
areas to repay these 
bonds or notes.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ The 
constitutional amend­
ment to authorize cities, 
towns, and other taxing 
units to encourage the 
improvement, develop­
ment, or redevelopment 
of certain areas through 
property tax relief and 
the issuance of bonds 
and notes.”

PROPOSITION NO. 2 
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution

117 proposes a constitu­
tional amendment that 
would authorize a person 
to receive a patent to land 
from the Commissioner of 
the General Land Office 
under certain conditions. 
Application for the patent 
must be made within five 
years from appi’oval of 
the amendment. The land 
must be surveyed, public 
free school land not pre­
viously patentable. The 
person must have a prop­
erly recorded deed to the 
land, which he acquired 
without knowledge of the 
patent defect and which 
title he and his predeces­
sors in interest have held 
for at least 50 years. The 
person and his predeces­
sors in interest must 
have continuously claimed 
the land and paid the 
taxes for at least 50 years.

This amendment does 
not apply to beach land, 
submerged land, or is­
lands. An applicant may 
not use this provision to

resolve a boundary dis­
pute. This amendment 
will not apply to land 
which has been deter­
mined to be state-owned 
by a court of competent 
jurisdiction or that has a 
productive state mineral 
lease on the effective date 
of the amendment.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorizing the 
commissioner of the 
General Land Office to 
issue patents for cer­
tain public free school 
fund land held in good 
faith under color of title 
for at least 50 years as 
of November 15, 1981.”

PROPOSITION NO. 3 
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution

38 proposes a constitu­
tional amendment that 
would enable the legisla­
ture to grant to a state 
finance management com­
mittee the authority to 
manage state funds. 
Founds constitutionally 
dedicated to specific pur­
poses would not be sub­
ject to committee man­
agement. The committee 
would be composed of the 
Governor, Lieutenant Gov­
ernor, Speaker of the 
House of Representatives, 
Chairman of the Sen­
ate P'inance Committee, 
Chairman of the House 
Appropriations Commit­
tee, Chairman of the Sen­
ate State Affairs Com­
mittee, and the Chairman 
of the House of Repre­
sentatives Ways and 
Means Committee.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on 
the ballot as follows: 
“ The constitutional 
amendment to allow 
the legislature to grant 
to a state finance man­
agement committee the 
power to manage the 
expenditure of certain 
appropriated funds.”

PROPOSITION NO. 4 
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution

6 proposes a constitutional 
amendment that would 
provide that one-half of 
the surplus tax revenues

above the spending limit 
provided by Article VIII, 
Section 22, of the Texas 
Constitution would be 
placed in a Water Assis­
tance Fund to be used as 
provided by law, includ­
ing projects for water de­
velopment” and conserva­
tion, water quality en­
hancement, and flood 
control purposes or any 
combination of these pur­
poses.

The amendment also 
provides $500,000,000 of 
the general credit of the 
state to guarantee bonds 
issued in commercial mar­
kets by local political sub­
divisions, including cities, 
counties, and special dis­
tricts. The amendment al­
lows amounts to be es­
tablished to decrease or 
retire state debt, which is 
defined as that debt se­
cured by the full faith 
and credit of the state. 
The amendment would 
raise the interest that 
could be paid on autho­
rized, but unissued, bonds 
guaranteed by the full 
faith and credit of the 
state from 6% to 129c. 

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorizing the 
use of a portion of the 
excess revenues of the 
state for water devel­
opment, water conser­
vation, water quality 
enhancement, and flood 
control purposes; au­
thorizing the use of the 
state’s credit, not to 
exceed five hundred 
million dollars, to guar­
antee the bonds of ci­
ties, counties, towns, 
and other units of local 
government in the f i ­
nancing of projects for 
such purposes; increas­
ing the interest rate 
that may be paid on 
previously approved, 
but unissued, state 
bonds; and authorizing 
a program to retire 
state bonds.”

PROPOSITION NO. 5 
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution

49 proposes a constitution­
al amendment that would 
exempt livestock and 
poultry from taxation. 
Currently, farm products 
in the hands of the pro­
ducer and family supplies 
for home and farm use 
are exempt.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ The 
constitutional amend­
ment to provide for the 
inclusion of livestock 
and poultry with farm 
products as exempt 
from taxation.”

PROPOSITI* N NO. 6 
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution

81 authorizes the govern­
ing body of a county, city, 
school district or other 
political subdivisions to 
exempt from taxation a 
portion of the market 
value of a residence 
homestead. The portion 
exempted may be as 
much as 409o for 1982- 
1984; 309'r for 1985-1987; 
and 209  ̂ for 1988 and af­
ter. The amount of an 
exemption may not be 
less than $5,000 unless 
the legislature by general 
law prescribes other 
monetai’y restrictions on 
the amount of the exemp­
tion. An eligible adult is 
allowed to receive other 
applicable exemptions 
provided by law. An ex­
ception is made where ad 
valorem tax has previous­
ly been pledged for the 
payment of debt.

The amendment further 
directs the legislature to 
require that notice be giv­
en to property owners of 
a reasonable estimate of 
tax on their property in 
certain situations.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorizing a po­
litical subdivision to 
provide property tax 
relief for owners of 
residence homesteads 
and changing certain 
property tax admini­
strative procedures.”

PROPOSITION NO. 7 
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution

4 proposes a constitution­
al amendment that would 
authorize the Veterans’ 
Land Board to issue and 
sell an additional $250,- 
000,000 in bonds increas­
ing the Veterans’ Land 
Fund’s total bond is­
suance authorization from 
$700,000,000 to $950,000,- 
000. The amendment 
would increase the maxi­
mum interest payable by 
the state on these bonds 
from 69r to 109?̂ , and 
permit an even higher 
rate, if specified by the 
legislatux’e.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: “ The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorizing the 
issuance of additional 
bonds to finance the 
veterans’ land progi'am 
and to increase the 
maximum interest rate 
allowable on veterans’ 
land fund bonds.”

Houndettes Triumph 
Over Woodson Girls

By DALE WAINSCOTT
Monday, the thirty-first of 

August, the Knox City Houn­
dettes Volleyball teams 
headed toward Woodson to 
play the Cowgirls. Our op­
ponents met us and we 
triumphed. The first varsity 
match was two games to zero 
with the game scores of 15-5 
and 15-12.

The Junior Varsity match 
was two games to zero with 
the game scores of 15-5 and 
15-9. The second varsity mat­
ch was also two games to 
zero, but the game scores of 
15-10 and 15-9.

Coaches Wainscott and 
Felan were not particularly 
satisfied with the performan­
ce of their teams. Although 
we did win, we did play to the 
best of our ability and are 
striving to better our best. 
This will prepare us for later 
matches.

Woodson’s low ceiling was 
a hampering factor but our 
service, spiking, and setting 
percentages were all down 
compared to our matches 
against Hawley but not 
drastically.

Sharon Roberson, with 91% 
and 20 out of 22 serves led our

dnive 55
team in scoring serves with 
Patty Durham close behind 
with 18 out of 19 and a percen­
tage of 95.

In spiking Mindy Hutchin­
son had seven out of eleven 
and a percentage of 64. 
Delores Stafford and Diane 
Helms had 4/4 for 100% and 
4/5 for 80%.

Our setters, Sharon Rober­
son: 8/8 serves and 100% and 
Mary Garcia: 14/15 and 93%, 
both did an outstanding job.

Labor Day was open for the 
Houndettes but last Monday 
we played Hamlin here at 
5:00. Next week we will have 
that report and next Monday 
we play Hawley there 5:00. 
Come and watch!

Top of the Line
HORSE & MULE 

FEED
« 2 0 0 » «

KNOX FEED LOT
817-658-3748 Nights 658-3741

ATTEND OPRY
Mr. and Mrs. Buddy Angle, 

Stacy Angle and Dave Thom­
pson were in Lubbock Satur­
day night to attend the West 
Texas Opry held at Municipal 
Auditorium on the campus of 
Texas Tech University.

They also visited with their 
daughter and grandson, 
Gwen and Clay Hewitt.

E

E i f c r i i c f l i

^Oil Field ^Industrial ^Repair 
^Wiring 'AIrrigation ^Commercial

DEPENDABLE INSTALLATIONS

C&R Electric

TH IS  PHARMACY IS 
DEVOTED TO BETTER  

HEALTH

The Code of Ethics governing the practice of I 
Pharmacy directs pharmacists to consider the j 
better health of the people they serve to be more'; 
important than greater profits.

We sincerely always try our best to obey our Code I 
of Ethics and all other laws regulating pharmacy, j 
We invite you to make this pharmacy your personal 
source for all your sick-room needs. Wnen our 
advice is asked about any product we are 
permitted to supply without a prescription, you will 
receive our honest answer. We do not comment 
about prescriptions. I

YOUR DOCTOR CAN PHONE US when you , 
need a medicine. Pick up your prescription if] 
shopping nearby, or we will deliver promptly without! 
extra charge. A great many people entrust us with* 
their prescriptions. May we compound yours?

H -M  J o n e s  
P h a rm a c y , Inc.

658-3921
IHJ. Jones 

658-3154
(817)658-3215 Don

658-3431

WILLIE COLLINS BILLY BOB REYNOLDS R . O R g R y R O R H R - y R O R a R l l R

AVISO PUBLICO
Breves Deelaraeiones Explicafivas 

De Las

ENMIENDAS CONSTITUCIONALES
FROFUESTAS 

ELECCION ESFECIAL 
3 DE NOVIEMBRE DE 1981

PROPOSICION NO. 1 
EN LA BOLETA

Resolucion Coujunta No. 
8 del Senado propone nnn 
enmicnda consfilncional 
qnc permit a a ht legisla- 
tnra autoriznr a ciudadeft, 
pueblos y otras entidades 
fiscales covcedcr exen- 
cioncs de impuestos por 
avaluo cn una area no pro- 
ductiva, siibdesarroUada o 
deteriorada para estininlar 
su desarroUn. La evmienda 
tambicn permitiria a la 
legislatura autoriznr a una 
ciudad o a un pueblo emitir 
bonos 0 vales para finan­
cial' este desnrrollo y em- 
peiiar futuros numentos 
en los ingresos de impnes- 
tos por avaluo sobre la 
propiednd en dichas areas 
para pagnr estos bonos o 
vales.

La enmienda propuesta 
npareeerd en la boletn 
como sique: “ La en­
mienda constitucional 
que autoriza a ciudades, 
pueblos, y otras enti- 
dades fiscales estimulnr 
el mejoramiento, desn­
rrollo, 0 redesarrollo de 
ciertas areas por medio 
de auxilio en los im­
puestos sobre la propie- 
dad y la emision de 
bonos y vales.”

PROPOSICION NO. 2 
EN LA BOLETA

Resolucion Con junta No. 
117 de la Camara de Repre- 
sentantes propone Una en­
mienda constitucional que 
autorice a una persona a 
recibir titulo de terreno 
del Comisionado de la 
Oficina General de Te- 
rrenos bajo ciertas con- 
diciones. La solicitud para 
el titulo se tiene que liacer 
dent TO de cinco aiios a 
jiartir de la aprobacion de 
la enmienda. El terreno 
tiene que ser terreno de las 
escuelas publicas libres, 
medido, y no previnmente 
titulado. La persona tiene 
que tener una escritura del 
terreno propiamente regis- 
trada, que adquirio sin 
saber del defecto de titulo 
y que el y sus antepasados 
interesados ban tenido por 
lo menos durante 50 aiios. 
La persona y sus ante­
pasados interesados tienen 
que haber reclamado el 
terreno continuamente y 
pagado los impuestos por 
lo menos durante 50 anos.

Esta enmienda no se 
aplica a terreno de playa, 
a terreno sumergido ni a 
islas. Un solicitante no 
jmede usar esta provision

para resolver una disputa 
de limites de terrenos. 
Esta enmienda no se aplica 
a terrenos que hayan sido 
declarados propiedad del 
estado por una corte de 
jurisdiccion competente ni 
a los que tienen un arrien- 
do estatal de minerales, los 
cuales estdn produciendo 
en la feeha efeetiva de la 
enmienda.

La enmienda propuesta 
aparecerd en la boleta 
como sigue: “ La en­
mienda, constitutional 
que autoriza al comisi­
onado de la Oficina 
General de Terrenos a 
dar titulos para ciertos 
terrenos del fondo para 
eseuelas pdblicas libres 
tenidos en buena fe bajo 
titulo aparente durante 
por lo menos cincuenta 
(50) aiios antes del 15 
de noviembre de 1981.”

PROPOSICION NO. 3 
EN LA BOLETA

Resolucion Con junta No. 
38 de la Camara de Repre­
sent antes propone una en­
mienda constitucional que 
autorice a la legislatura 
conceder a un comite esta­
tal de administracion fi- 
nanciera la autoridad de 
administrar fondos esta- 
tales. Los fondos destina- 
dos por la constitucion a 
fines especificos no es- 
tarian sujetos a la ad­
ministracion del comite. El 
comite estaria compuesto 
del Gobernador, el Gober- 
nador Teniente, el Presi- 
dente de la Camara de 
Representantes, el Presi- 
dente del Comite de Fi- 
nanzas del Senado, el 
Presidente del Comite de 
Asignaciones de la Camara 
de Representantes, el 
Presidente del Comite de 
Asuntos de Estado y el 
Presidente del Comite de 
Medios y Arbitrios de la 
Camara de Represen­
tantes.

La enmienda propuesta 
aparecerd en la boleta 
como sigue: “ La en­
mienda constitucional 
que permite a la legis­
latura conceder a un 
comite estatal de ad­
ministracion financiera 
la autoridad de adminis­
trar el gasto de ciertos 
fondos api'opiados.”

PROPOSICION NO. 4 
EN LA BOLETA

Resolucion Con junta No. 
6 de la Camara de Repre­
sentantes propone una en­
mienda constitucional que 
disponga que la mitad de

los ingresos sobrantes de 
impuestos, sobre el limite 
de gastos disjiuesto por el 
Articulo VIII, Seccion 22, 
de la Constitucion de Tex­
as, sean depositados en un 
Fondo de Asistencia del 
Agua a ser usados como 
provea la ley, incluso en 
proyectos para el desa- 
rrollo y la conservacion del 
agua, la mejoria de la 
calidad del agua, el con­
trol de innndaeiones o 
para cualquier eombina- 
cion de estos propositos.

La enmienda tambien 
pravee $500,000,000 del 
credito general del estado 
para garantizar bonos 
emitidos en mercados 
comerciales por subdivi- 
siones politicos locales, 
incluso ciudades, condados 
y distritos especiales. La 
enmienda permite que se 
establezcan cantidades 
para disminuir o para 
retirar deudas del estado, 
las cuales se definen como 
deudas garantizadas por la 
plena fe y el credito del 
estado. La enmienda au- 
mentaria el interes que se 
pueda pagar en bonos 
autorizados pero no emiti­
dos, garantizados por la 
plena fe y el credito del 
estado, de 67r a 12%.

La enmienda propuesta 
aparecerd en la boleta 
como sigue: La enmien­
da constitucional que 
autoriza el uso de una 
porcion de los ingresos 
sobrantes del estado 
para el desarrollo, la 
conservacion y la me­
joria de la calidad del 
agua y para el control 
de inundaciones; que 
autonza el uso del credi­
to del estado, no en 
exceso de quinientos mi- 
llones de dolares, para 
garantizar los bonos 
de ciudades, condados, 
pueblos, y otras entida- 
des de gobierno local en 
la financiacion de pro­
yectos dedicados a tales 
fines; que aumenta la 
tasa dc interes que se 
puede pagar por bonos 
estatales previamente 
aprobados pero no emi­
tidos; y que autoriza un 
programa para pagar 
bonos.”

PROPOSICION NO. 5 
EN LA BOLETA

Resolucion Con junta No. 
49 de la Camara de Repre­
sentantes propone una en­
mienda constitucional que 
dejaria libres de impues­
tos el ganado y las aves. 
Actualmente los productos 
agricolas en manos del 
productor y las provisiones 
familiares para el uso de 
la casa y de la granja 
estdn libres de impuestos.

La enmienda propuesta 
aparecerd en la boleta 
como sigue: “ La en­
mienda constitucional 
que permite incluir el 
ganado y las aves con 
los productos agricolas 
libres de impuestos.”

PROPOSICION NO. 6 
EN LA BOLETA

Resolucion Con junta No. 
81 de la Camara de Repre­
sentantes autoriza al 
cuerpo gobernante de un 
condado, una ciudad, un 
distrito escolar u otras 
subdivisiones politicas de- 
clarar libre de impuestos 
una porcion del valor de 
mercado de un hogar de 
residencia. La porcion 
libre de impuestos puede 
ser hasta j0%  para el 
periodo 1982-198^; 30%
para 1985-1987; y 20% 
para 1988 y los anos sigui- 
entes. La cantidad de la 
exencion no puede ser 
menos de $5,000 a menos 
que la legislatura por ley 
general prescriba otras 
rcstricciones monetarias de 
la cantidad de exencion. 
A un adulto elegible se le 
permite recibir otras 
cxenciones aplicables pro­
vistas por la ley. Se hace 
excepcion en caso de que 
los impuestos por avaluo 
hayan sido comprometidos 
previamente para el pago 
de deudas.

La enmienda ademds 
dirige a la legislatura que 
requiera que se les de a los 
propietarios una estima- 
cion razonable de im- 
pucsto sobre su propie­
dad en ciertas situaciones. 

La enmienda propuesta 
aparecerd en la boleta 
como sigue: “ La en­
mienda constitucional 
que autoriza a una sub­
division politica proveer 
auxilio en los impuestos 
sobre la propiedad para 
los duenos de hogares de 
residencia y que cambia 
ciertos procedimientos 
administrativos en los 
impuestos sobre la pro­
piedad.”

PROPOSICION NO. 7 
EN LA BOLETA

Resolucion Con junta No. 
4 de la Camara de Repre­
sentantes propone una en­
mienda que autorice a la 
Junta de Terrenos para 
Veteranos poner en circu- 
lacion y vender bonos 
adicionales en la cantidad 
de $250,000,000 lo cual 
aumentaria de $700,000,- 
000 a $950,000,000 la au- 
torizacion total de circu- 
lacion de bonos del Fondo 
de Terrenos para Vet­
eranos. La enmienda au­
mentaria el interes maxi­
ma payable por el estado 
por estos bonos de 6% a 
10% y permitiria una 
tarifa nun mas alta si 
fuera especificada por la 
legislatura.

La enmienda propuesta 
aparecerd en la boleta 
como sigue: “ La en­
mienda constitucional 
que autoriza la emision 
de bonos adicionales 
para financiar el pro­
grama de terrenos para 
veteranos y que aumenta 
la tarifa maxima de in­
teres que se permite en 
los bonos del fondo de 
terrenos para vetera-



LIONS CLUB NEWS
By JAMES PATTERSON

Wednesday, September 9
The meeting was called to 

order by Lion President Dick 
Evatt. The song, “ Don’t You 
Hear Those Lions Roar” was 
sung (almost a solo by the 
song leader). After a “ Word 
of Thanks” , another delicious 
meal was received by 40 
hungry people including 
Lions, Sweetheart, and a 
guest.

When guests were called 
for at the south table, this 
rather familiary looking per­
son turned out not to be a 
guest, at all, but Lion Zeb 
Smith, who explained that he 
was just back from “ east 
Texas” . Another whom some 
wondered about was Lion 
Terry Keener behind a 
“ growth of beard”  - he was 
welcomed back. As it turned 
out, we had no guests except 
our program who will be in­
troduced, later.

The Lion Boss read the 
program chairmen list, 
which had been determined 
by “ lottery”  at the last 
cabinet meeting. There are 
Lion John Crownover on Sep­
tember 16, Lion Sweetheart 
Mindy Hutchinson on Sep­
tember 23, Lion Dick Evatt on 
September 30, Lion Sammy 
B, White on October 7, Lion 
Barney B. Arnold on October 
14, Lion Sterling Lewis on Oc­
tober 21, Lion Bill Baker on 
October 28, Lion Don 
Hawkins on November 4, 
Lion Lewis Kay on November 
11, Lion James Patterson on 
November 18, Lion Jimmy 
Lynn on November 25, Lion 
Ray Goodrich on December 
2, Lion Otto Lawson on 
December 9, Lion Pete 
Williams on December 16, no 
meeting on December 23, and 
Lion Don Bunton on Decem­
ber 30.

The Lion Boss also reported 
on the “ Jerry Lewis 
Telethon” . There was good 
response to the telephone an­
swering service and 
expressed “ Thanks!”  to all

Treat Those Blisters Before 
They Become Infected

If you run, jog or play 
tennis for fun or fitness, 
you share a problem with 
millions o f  active Ameri­
cans: the BLISTER.

Although blisters may 
rank among minor health 
complaints, they are none- 
the-less painful and prone to 
infection. First aid experts 
and doctors warn that blis­
ters need immediate atten­
tion to avoid complications 
later on.

As a matter o f fact, your 
feet require routine care 
after all athletic activities 
including long walks. They 
should be washed (soaked, 
if you have time), powdered 
and hosiery changed.

If you notice a blister 
(you ’ll probably feel it be­
fore you see it), resist the 
urge to  break it. If you 
“ pop”  the blister, you will 
leave the raw skin under­
neath exposed and prone to 
infection. It will also be 
painful to the touch and to 
the shoe.

To care for a blister prop­
erly, cleanse the affected 
area with warm water and 
mild soap. Treat with an 
application o f a small 
amount o f first aid cream or 
topical antibiotic ointment. 
Cover the area with a non­
stick sterile pad and secure 
with a first aid tape. For a 
small blister, use a Band- 
Aid. This process en­
courages safe healing and 
also cushions the blister so 
that your shoe will not rub 
against it.

The primary cause o f blis­
ters is ill fitting shoes and 
sneakers. When you shop, 
take your time. Walk 
around the store to see how 
well the shoes fit.

It makes good sense to 
protect your feet. Remem­
ber, you can’t perform, if 
your feet won’t.

Use The 
Classifieds

who helped. People in the 
Knox City area responded 
well, too, to the tune of 
$1,131.00 for Muscular 
Dystrophy Fund.

Lion John Smith was sup­
posed to have been program 
chairman, but since he had 
not been notified. Lion John 
Gillispie served in his place 
and presented Coach Jimmy 
Rogers to say something 
about this year’s football 
team. He gave us an in­
teresting resume and it shows 
to be an exciting year ahead. 
We have 10 lettermen back 
this year ~ five offensive and 
five defensive players. 
Aspermont is favored in the 
district, then Knox City, 
Rule, and Jay ton (in that or­
der) - but either could win 
without a big surprise to any. 
We will run a JV schedule this 
year. We need to be thinking 
about our “ young people”  
and make every effort to sup­
port them. It’s expensive to 
play “ athletics”  - we’re not 
wasting our money when we 
invest in “ young people” , 
we’re making a good and 
wise investment. This year’s 
Greyhounds have a good 
chance to be district champs 
and they are making a big ef­
fort to represent their town

Engagement
Announced

Mr. and Mrs. Adalbert von 
Gontard of Greenwich, Con­
necticut, announce the 
engagement and approaching 
marriage of their daughter, 
Marie Eugenie, to Jerry Bob 
Daniel, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Daniel of Truscott.

The couple plan an outdoor 
western style wedding on Oc­
tober 10, at the Pitchfork 
Ranch where the bride-elect 
is employed as overseer of 
the mare operation.

The prospective bride­
groom is employed as ranch 
foreman of the King County 
Ranch.

Locals’ Grandson 
Wed In Fort Worth
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Mary’s Beauty Salon

RTA Luncheon 
Set For Tuesday

The Retired Teachers 
Association will have a salad 
luncheon at twelve noon 
Tuesday, September 22, at 
the Community Center.

All members are asked to 
bring their favorite salad and 
games will be played during 
the afternoon following a 
business session where club 
yearbooks will be distributed.

Hostesses will be Margaret 
Siecke, Sudia Cash, Louise 
Finley, and Mary Frances 
Shannon.

well. They may not express it
to everyone, but, deep down,' 
they appreciate all the sup­
port they get - even though 
they do not say it. We have a 
black quarterback this year, 
also, a white one to back him 
up - so, we’ll be able to go 
either way. This year we’ll go 
in as “ underdogs”  against 
Munday - but last year, they 
were the “ underdogs”  and 
they beat us - so, maybe, this 
year we will beat them.

Lion Sweetheart Mindy 
Hutchinson drew the name 
from the box which turned 
out to be Lion John Smith - he 
was present. His wife will 
receive a gift from the Knox 
City Lions Club of a new pair 
of hose.

The meeting was closed 
with the Pledge of Allegiance 
to the Flag of the United 
States of America - led by our 
Boss Lion.

Corley Home 
‘Yard Of Month’

The yard of the month 
honors for September have 
been presented to Mrs. Bon­
nie Corley at 500 South Third 
by the Knox City Garden 
Club.

Garden Club members 
Gladys Reed and Lena 
McCJee made the selection for 
the overall neatness.

CYPERT VISITORS
Visiting in the home of Mr. 

and Mrs. J.T. Cypert Labor 
Day weekend were their son 
and his family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lyndol Cypert, Timothy and 
Lance of San Antonio.

Also visiting were Jere’s 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Rudolph Moore of Plainview 
and a niece, Carla Moore of 
Lubbock.

IN LYNN HOME 
Visiting Labor Day 

weekend in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Lynn and Steve 
were their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. David Anderson of 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma; 
David’s sister, Amy of 
Abilene; Mr. and Mrs. Jim­
my Lynn, also of Abilene; 
and Scott Lynn of Angelo 
State University in San 
Angelo.

ATTEND HAIR SHOW 
Beverly Chaney and Mary 

Elliston recently attended the 
Armstrong-Mc(I!all hair show 
held at the Kiva Inn in 
Abilene.

T a k e .
. sto ck Vs

Leah Ullman and Ricky 
Mayfield, grandson of Mr. 
and Mrs. J.C. McGee, were 
married Saturday evening, 
September 12, at 7:(X) o’clock 
in the evening in St. Luke’s 
United Methodist Church in 
Haltom City.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Ullman of 
Fort Worth, and the 
bridegroom’s parents are Mr.

KC COLORED 
NEWS EVENTS

Mrs. Annie Mae Moss is a 
patient in the Knox County 
Hospital from a broke hand 
we hope her stay wont be to 
long before she will be home 
and hope she will be careful 
next time around.

Clarence Morton of 
Rochester is also a patient in 
the hospital. We are asking 
your prayers for Mr. Morton.

St. Paul held their Sunday 
school with a small attendan­
ce the lesson was well taught 
and discuss by the class, 
reviewed by the Supt. The 
Church of the living God 
morning service was very 
spiritful the pastor preach 
from Isa. 58:1-2, Job- 17:8 
“ Make A Loud Noise Unto 
The Lord.”

Sunday afternoon the 
children of Mrs. Amie Joe 
Flye. gave her a surprise bir­
thday party and were she 
surprise. I said she was. her 
daughter from Hereford 
came in and she didn’t no 
about it, so after the tears 
flowed and hugging stop 
everything were just lovely. 
Many friends enjoyed cake , 
punch and sandwiches the 
party were a back yard affair 
at the home of her son and 
daughter-in-law. Bo and 
Glaida.

SERVICES OF THE 
CHURCH OF GOD 

IN CHRIST
On last Tuesday night a 

part of the members attended 
service at the Munday Chur­
ch. Minister George 
Washington Jr. preached 
over there from Mark 16: 15, 
18, “ We Need the (Jospel” , a 
powerful message.

We are thankful to the Lord 
for his blessings in each ser­
vice held during the week 
here.

Sunday school had a good 
attendance with the Asst. 
Supt. Minister Tilly in 
charge.

In the morning service, 
Elder David Carroll of 
Wichita Falls brought the 
message with references to 
Jeremiah 23:29 and other 
scriptures.

The closing service of 
Elder and Sister Blue’s 14th 
anniversary was held at the 
Munday Church on Sunday

Do You Need A 
Good Health 

Insurance Plan?

IMPORTANT NOTICE TO MEMBERS
OF

TEXAS FARM BUREAU

The Texas Farm Bureau Board of Directors has decided 
that the TFB's Group Medical Insurance Program will be 
insured by The Travelers Insurance Company effective 
October 1, 1981. The Travelers is an outstanding com­
pany with a reputation of excellent service and 3 health 
insurance plans are available to members of the Texas 
Farm Bureau.

Your Board of Directors also approved a Special Limited 
Open Enrollment for people whose Farm Bureau 
membership was current as of July 22, 1981. If you are 
eligible, you may enroll in our new plan without 
evidence of insurability and only be subject to the pre­
existing conditions for 12 months.

You must exercise this option during September 7-24, 
1981! After this time period all applicants must satisfy 
underwriting.

Call your County Farm Bureau office now for information 
about our health insurance plans and rates!!

and Mrs. Howard Mayfield.
The bride was given in 

marriage by her father.
Orville Dear, the McGees’ 

son-in-law, performed the 
ceremony before an archway 
of silk flowers, made 
especially for the couple by 
Mrs. Gwen Falco of Dallas, 
who also made all the flowers 
for the wedding. She is the 
daughter of R.L. Anderson on 
the Ratliff Ranch.

The reception was hosted 
by the bride’s friends in the 
dining hall of the church. 
Receiving with the bride and 
groom were the couple’s 
parents and also Mr. and 
Mrs. McGee.

The rehearsal dinner was 
given in the home of the 
bridegroom’s parents who 
were assisted by Mr. and 
Mrs. Orville Dear and the 
McCJees on Friday night.

After a short honeymoon, 
the couple will be at home in 
Woodhaven Apartments in 
Fort Worth.

The bride is employed by 
Salene Valley Lumber Com­
pany, and the bridegroom is a 
salesman at Southland 
Plumbing Company.

Both attended Tarrant 
County Junior College in Fort 
Worth.

817-658-3056
119 Central Knox City, Texas

-  Men’s and Women’s Hair Styling -- 
Ear Piercing ■ Frosting - Bleaches - Manicures

Mary Elliston Beverly Chaney
Mon., Wed., Thurs. Wednesday,
Fri. & Sat. Thurs. & Fri.

VISIT OUR NEW GIFT BAZAAR
Cosmetic Bags - Coin Purses - Bags - Beits 

Pins - Buckles - Ceramic Dresser Accessories
(SUCH AS MIRROR LIPSTICK HOLDERS, ASHTRA YS. ETC.)

i i

Mr. and Mrs. Ken Pierson 
of Abilene are the proud 
parents of a baby girl born 
Wednesday, September 9, at 
8:56p.m.

She has been named 
Christal Dawn and she 
weighed in at seven pounds, 
seven ounces and measured 
21 inches long.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. A.A. Pierson of O’Brien, 
James Bolton of Buffalo Gap, 
and Mrs. Eunice Chappell of 
Raleigh, North Carolina.

Great-grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Fox Bolton of 
Turkey and Mrs. Lula Penny 
of North Carolina.

evening. Elder and Sister 
Blue have laboured faithfully 
at the Munday Church these 
past 14 years.

Elder Major Johnson 
preached Sunday evening 
from Luke 17: 11,19, a power­
ful message.

------ - End of Season------
Savings

at Paducah Implement Co

We have a full line of

I \E W  H O U .A ^ D Hay Equipment
from 851 Balers to 114 Pivot Tongue 

Swathers, for all your Hay needs

come by

Paducah Implement Co.

David Gibbs 
492-2038

Paducah, Texas or call (806) 492-3551 

-Nights- Rufus Gibbs 
492-3159

T H EALL-SAVERS CD.
TAX FREE.BEGINS 
(XTOBER 1.
SIGN UP NOW!

CONVERT YOUR 
6- MONTH MONEY 
MARKET C.D. TO  
THE ALL-SAVERS 
C.D. NO PENALTY!

F g n c j

Beginning October 1, 1981, OIney Savings will offer a 
1-yeor certificate which pays tax-free interest — up to 
$ 2 ,0 00  for married couples filing jointly, $ 1 ,0 0 0  for an indi­
vidual. $500  minimum required.

This tax-free feature is not the only attraction of the 
All-Savers C.D. It will also return a high yield. For many sav­
ers, the All-Savers C .D .’s tax free yield will be higher than 
the after-tax yield available in other types of accounts. And 
the OIney Savings All-Savers C.D. is insured by the 
F.S.L.I.C., up to $ 1 0 0 ,0 0 0 .

Come in and talk with us about the All-Savers C.D. W e’re 
prepared to answer any questions you have and we can 
begin now to set up your All-Savers C.D. W e’re ready to 
help.

Come see us soon. Or call and we’ll come see you.

If your family 
income is:

Your Tax Bracket 
probably is:

Interest rate needed 
to net 1 2 .6 1%  after 
federal income tax is:

$ 2 0 ,0 0 0  or less 25% 16.81%

$ 2 5 ,0 0 0 30% 18.01%

$ 3 5 ,0 0 0 40% 21.02%

$ 5 0 ,0 0 0  or 
more

50% 2 5 .2 5 %

The above figures are approximate and are based on 1981 tax tables. The 1 2 .61%  
interest rate is equal to 7 0%  of average investment yield on one year U.S. Treasury 
Bills as of more recent auction date.

OLNEY
S/J/INGS
OIney, Seymour, Jacksboro, Bridgeport, Nocono, 
Weatherford, Azie, Graham, Archer City, Brownwood, 
Bowie and Wichita Falls. Also Electro Savings in Elec­
tro, Ranger Savings in Ranger, Eastland Savings in 
Eastland. All Divisions of OIney Savings.
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feANCH STYLE

LACKEYED
P E A S

15-Oz.
Cans

00

GLADIOIA^'FLOUR
FOOD 

STAMPS 
WELCOME

5 - L b .
B a g 99

WHITE SWAN

29- OX.

^ i i c H  HALVES

CAKE
MIX 69

CASSEROLE

Pinto Beans
4 “ $169
KRAFT

RED PLUM
J A M

89

FROM OUR DEU

fresh cooked $  AHOT LINKS  ̂ i
FRESHCOOKEO ^ A CPINTO BEANS . 0 7
BartMcMd Betl i*$2.29

CRUNCHY ^  A  C

r m  i !  s t a w  . 0 7

(Keni Specioh

SIEAK
"  « 2.29

|8-Oz. Jar

2 4 0 Z .  C a n

MR.C0 FFE,
i4R. COFFEE 
00 FILTERS

GLADIOLA

F l o u r
2 5 -lb. Bog

DEL MONTE

CATSUP^
2 ^ -O z .  Btle

8 9 t

Kraft
Sandwich 
Spread

DELSEY BATHROOM

TISSUE

DOWNY
F A B R IC  

S O F T E N E R
$

|FRESH GROUND
h A M B U R G E R I

COOCN'S GERMAN

s a u s a g e to.

FRYERS 59
n O A H C  " A "  aUSDA GRADE "A

0

1 0 O Z .  f

k CELLO CALIFORNIA

CARROTS 29 c i

•M i

Health A Beautv Ald«

JERGEN’S . . .  
LOTION $ p

1 0 - 0 *  I 
R p i K - l

-.aSElHG
4 ”

VjDAL SASSOON

SHAMPOO & C O N D IT IO N E

RUSSETPOTATOES
FR U ITS tVEC irAB lI?^,* , ,10-Lb.

Bag

CORN
J 6 j i i 9 9

h o n e y
BUNS

°  59

I
)

C A L I F O R N I A

BELL PEPPERS d / 9 9 *  

ONIONS >‘7,̂
I
k

m
S U P ER  D ISC O U N T S P EC IA LS

WITH FILLED Buccarioer discount booklets

VIP

Sirawberries

fS 5 9 «

BISCUITS
,1008-Oz.

Cans
WiTHfACHPIUlO _ 

DISCOUNT



Bob Craig 
Is Buried 
In Hamlin

Brackman Cartoons To Appear In KC News
The Knox County News will 

feature cartoons by Mike 
Brackman in future editons 
as space permits.

Brackman, a pilot for

Christensen Aviation and 
manager for Christensen’s 
operations at the Knox City 
Municipal Airport, began 
drawing at an early age as his 
father, David Brackman, is 
an artist. He basically draws 
cartoons with a country- 
western flair and oil paints

some of them, he said.
A native of Katy, Texas, 

where his parents still live, 
Mike became involved with 
flying when he began as an 
aviation mechanic. He later 
went to work for Cessna Air­
craft where he trained as a 
pilot. He has been flying since

1968 and began agricultural 
spraying in 1971.

Mike, his wife Gloria, and 
children Jeremy, Chad, 
Rebecca, and Shane, moved 
here last February and reside 
on South Third.

iCropland Can Be 
Ipestroyed By Gullies

Farabee Appointed To 
Education Committee

> P r o d u c t iv e  crop la nd ,  
^valued at several hundred 
'dpllars an acre, can be 

"destroyed and scarred by 
gullies “ eating”  their way in­
to fields. These gullies are 

- caused where water courses 
, are taking rainfall runoff into 
'river channels such as the 
Brazos and Wichita Rivers. 
.Gullies of this nature also oc- 
•:;cur where cropland borders 
'’along “ badlands” throughout 
the county.

i  Sometimes these gullies 
^'can be stopped by building 

terraces and waterways or by 
'-shaping and establishing to 
" vegetation. Unfortunately, 

this is not always the case. 
:Due to the lay of the land and 

^the amount of drainage 
coming into the gully, a 
Grade Stabilization Structure 

• ;may be needed in order to 
stop the erosion. The most 
common, and one of the 
cheaper Grade Stabilization 

.Structures, is a dam with a 
pipe through the embank­
ment to draw the water down. 

jviTlie elevation of the pipe is 
set at the same elevation as 

; the headcut in the gully.

These types of structures are 
designed where the emergen­
cy spillway around the end of 
the dam should only function 
about one time every 25 
years. Pipe sizes vary depen­
ding on storage and drainage 
area in front of the dam. 
These pipe structures are 
made out of corrugated metal 
pipe and in this area vary in 
size from 12”  to 54”  in 
diameter.

If readers have a problem 
like the one mentioned above 
and want to get it stopped 
before it destroys anymore 
valuable cropland, they are 
asked to stop by the Soil Con­
servation Service office. Cost 
share is available to install 
Grade Stabilization struc­
tures as well as other erosion 
control structures. The 
Wichita-Birazos Conservation 
District provides technical 
assistance through the Soil 
Conservation Service located 
at Knox City.

Senator Ray Farabee has 
recently been appointed to 
serve on the 18 member 
Select Committee on Public 
Education in Texas. The 
Committee will hold its first 
meeting on September 11 in 
Austin. Lieutenant Governor 
Bill Hobby will be chairman 
of the Committee.

“ More bills improving 
public education were passed 
by the 67th Legislature than 
by any other since I have 
been in the Senate,”  noted 
Farabee. The Texas 
educational system will be 
undergoing changes as a

, s t o c k \ 5 ^

result of recent policy 
decisions in areas such as 
curriculum reform, correct- 
ordered bilingual education, 
and requirements relating to 
teacher competency. Local 
independent school district 
will be in the best position to 
re-evaluate their current 
programs, and the Commit­
tee will provide a forum for 
cooperation and com ­
munication relating to public 
education in Texas.

“ High quality education for 
the citizen of Texas is a major 
public concern, and a large 
portion o f  the State’s total 
budget is appropriated for 
education. Over the next 
biennium, there is a $2.6 
billion increase in state fun­
ding for education, Goree 
School District will receive 
an estimated $199,311; Knox 
City-O’Brien ISD, $872,344 
and Benjamin ISD, $212,429 
an additional state funding 
for 1981-82’,”  Farabee said.

Dr. C.L Cromwell
OPTOMETRIST

Phone

(915) 773-3542 

STAMFORD

deM ftm en t
: MOVIES AND BOOKS

ON V ID EO  DISCS
y A single book with 15,000 

gages or a movie on a record? 
- Modern science is making 

these things happen through 
Vthe use o f  video technology.

OLNEY
SAVIN G S/IN VESTM EN T

PLAN

y The disc type still vid- 
j*eo recorder developed by 

Matsushita can record up to 
: 15-,'000 still images on a sin- 
•'gle disc. The still video re­
corder can literally store 
books o f information on a 

“ single disc.
Any one o f the 15,000 

images can. be shown in less 
'than a half second. The 
-disc-type still video recorder 
rdtiSy some day replace tele- 
;phone books, shopping cata- 
-Jdi|is and even conventional 
lljtwiness storage systems. 
'The bulky file cabinet o f  to- 
'day  may be reduced to a 
'jsingle disc.yV' ♦ ♦ *

Another example o f  the 
V H D  disc o f  Matsushita 
Electric is a “ video record 

• player”  which uses small 
; discs to play back movies, 
^11 stereo concerts or edu- 

, Rational and instructional 
^programs. The system can 
• ĵilay up to 2 hours and has 
>^many features including for- 
i;^ward and reverse fast and 
J'»§low motion, picture search, 
’ tfreeze frame, and frame-by- 
»iiframe stop action.

Sounds like the “ World 
’’ ^ .T om orrow ”  can be seen 
.^2tj^ay.

fflGH YIELD. 
FLEXIBILITY. 
FLOATING RATE.

ESLC

Olney Savings now offers a new way to invest your money. 
The Olney Savings/Investment Plan. It’s designed to give you 
a high yield. And because you can withdraw amounts of $500 
or more at any time without penalty, it gives you the flexibility 
you need in these changing times.

The interest rate is determined daily by Olney Savings and 
may change from day to day. A minimum of $2,000 is required 
to open your account. This plan is a repurchase agreement 
and you may renew by a simple phone call, by mail, or in 
person.

The Olney Savings/Investment Plan is backed by guaran­
teed U.S. Government securities, protected by the strength 
and resources of Olney Savings and is not insured by the 
F.S.L.I.C.

For the investor looking for short term, high yield and flexi­
bility, the Olney Savings/Investment Plan is ideal.

Talk to one of our savings counselors. They’re prepared to 
answer any questions you have. We want to help.

Come see us soon. Or call and we’ll come see you.

OLNEY
SA/INGS
Olney, Seymour, Jocksboro, Bridgeport, Nocono, 
Weatherford, Azle, Grohom, Archer City, Brownwood, 
Bowie and Wichita Falls. Also Electro Savings in Electro, 
Ronger Savings in Ranger, Eastland Savings in Eastland. 
All Divisions of Olney Savings.

Cotton Producers 
To Pay For Classing

Funeral services for 
Hamlin Herald publisher Bob 
Craig, 50, who died of an ap- 
parant heart attack Sunday, 
September 13, at 12:35 a.m. in 
a Hamlin hospital, were held 
Tuesday morning, September 
15, at 10:30 o’clock in the Fir­
st United Methodist Church in 
Hamlin. The Rev. Larry 
Adams, church pastor, of­
ficiated and burial was in the 
Hamlin Cemetery.

Mr. Craig, a past president 
of the West Texas Press 
Association, was the son of 
the late Roy Craig, longtime 
publisher of the Stamford 
Am erican, who was in­
strumental in the beginning 
of The Knox County News in 
October 1971.

Born September 29,1930, in 
Brownsville, he attended 
Stamford schools, Texas Tech 
and North Texas State 
Universities. He became 
publisher of the Hamlin 
Heraid in 1960. Mr. Craig had 
also served as secretary- 
treasurer of WTPA for 12 
years.

A past president of the 
Hamlin Board of Community 
Development and the Hamlin 
Lions Club, he was also active 
in the Boy Scouts and was 
serving on the Jones County 
District Tax Appraisal Board 
at the time of his death.

He married Barbara Fin­
cher on June 8, 1950, at 
Albany and was a member of 
the Central Christian Church 
of Stamford.

He is survived by his wife of 
the home; two sons. Dr. 
Darrell Craig of Little Rock, 
Arkansas, and Rick Craig of 
Hamlin; a daughter Beth 
Craig of Thousand Oaks, 
California; his mother, Mrs. 
D.E. Kelly of Phillips; his 
stepmother, Mrs. James 
(Dorothy) Drain of Stam­
ford; four sisters, Mrs. M.H. 
(Patricia) Williamson of 
Houston, Mrs. Pern (Celeste) 
Rocap of Montgomery, 
Alabama, Mrs. Stephen D. 
(Bernie) Briggs of Wilcox, 
Arizona, and Jennifer Craig 
of Stamford; four nieces and 
two nephews.

The Omnibus Recon­
ciliation Act of 1981, signed by 
the President August 13,1981, 
established a user fee effec­
tive October 1,1981, for cotton 
classing services provided 
for producers by USDA.

The proposed fee is 60 cents 
per sample. Producers will 
be billed on a monthly basis 
for each sample submitted by 
a licensed gin or warehouse 
with a completed cotton 
classification memorandum, 
CN-117 (green card). Gins 
may agree to assume respon­
sibility for collecting the fee 
as a service to their 
customers. This will greatly 
facilitate the billings and 
keep cost of the classing ser­
vice as low as possible.

Cotton samples classed for 
producers prior to October 1, 
1981, will be free of charge, 
the same as previous years. 
The 60 cent fee will be 
charged for all cotton classed 
for producers beginning Oc­
tober 1, 1981, and the first 
bills will be mailed at the end 
of October 1981.

As in the past, samples 
must be drawn by a licensed 
gin or warehouse and for­
warded directly to the 
Marketing Services Office. 
The name and complete ad­
dress of the producer must be 
entered on the green card if 
the producer is to be billed.

The Omnibus Recon­
ciliation Act directs USDA to 
provide the classing service 
to producers for a fee that 
when combined with 
proceeds from the sale of 
samples will recover, as 
nearly as practical, the cost 
of providing the service in­
cluding administrative and 
supervisory costs. The
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sure that the government cot­
ton classification system con­
tinues to provide an official 
quality description of the 
United States cotton crop.

Any additional questions 
concerning user fees should 

Secretary is also directed to ^e directed to the Marketing 
take necessary action to in- Services Office

-  .xu ! c »«i"m ** 111 If 11

PLUMBING-HEATING 
AIR-CONDITIONING
Jerry’s Plumbing

658-3322 202 East Main Knox City

BAND
SUPERB
SMORGASBORD

FRIDAY, SEPT. 18 
KC SCHOOL CAFETERIA 

6:00 P.M. to 7:30 P.M.

$3.00 Adults
(includes membership)

$1.5012 sunder

BAND WILL ENTERTAIN 

■SPONSORED BY-

KNOX CITY BAND BOOSTERS

STOP EXPENSIVE PAINTING
United States Steel Siding

UNITED STATES VINYL SIDING 
ALUMINUM REPLACEMENT WINDOWS

100% FINANCING AVAILABLE

C.W. “Dutch” Benson Construction
Authorized Dealer

BENJAMIN PHONE 817-454-2281

^ t c l ] t t a  ^ a l l s  ^ e c o r h

The morning newspaper you 
can count on every day for 
the latest news

International and National News 
State News Farm and Ranch News
Sport News Market Pages
Area News Youth and School News

L e s s  th a n  1 6  cents a co p y 
w ith  a n n u a l s u b s c rip tio n

Annual rates for mail subscribers only
Act now and be guaranteed delivery for a full year at the 
present postal rate. By mail in Texas and O klahom a only.

Save $46.50 over the newsstand price of 
$104.25 with a year’s subscription to the 
Wichita Falls Record News and Sunday Times 
or the Wichita Falls evening and Sunday 
Times. Please indicate your choice on the 
coupon below. Either way you pay only $57.75.

Send your order today
Mail to; Wichita Fails Record News 

Box 120
Wichita Falls TX 76307

□  W .F. Record News and Sunday.................................. $ 57 .75
(includes $33.00 mailing cost) ^

□  W .F . Tim es and S u n d ay ................................................ $ 57 .75
(includes $33.00 mailing cost)

N a m e ...............................................................................................................
Address................................................ Box N o ...........................................
C ity................................. S ta te ............ Zip C o de ....................... ................

□  M oney Order Enclosed □  Check Enclosed

Mail delivery will begin as soon as your m oney order or 
check is received.
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 ̂STAMPS ̂

AFFILIATED  
SUPER MARKETS

K N O X  C IT Y

THE SEASON FOR...

FRiENDiY f u m i  s a v i n g s  f

WE
GIVE

ARMOUR

TREET

Trrrrnrn

W EDNESDAYS
With the purchase of $2.50 or more.

SUGAR
^ L b .  i f l  0 9
Bag ^

SPECIALS G O O D  THURS., 
FRl.' SAT., SEPT. 17-18-19

'^Produce'A'

Lim it one with $10.00 grocery purchase 
or more excluding cigarettes and beer.

HEINZ KEG ‘O

Ketchup
32-oz., Limit 2

89«
ARMOUR STAR
VIENNA

SAUSAGE

WOLF
HOT DOG SAUCE

3
10.5- o z . i l f f l

Cans H

U.S. No. 1 RUSSET

POTATOES
1.69

5-oz. Cans

2/
LUCKY LEAF
APPLE
SAUCE

16-oz. Jars

----002 / 1
36-Ct. Stalk

CELERY
G reen O n ion s 
o r  R ad ish es S l o r  1 ■

Soft ‘N Pretty Bathroom

Tissue
4-Roll Pkg.

XUCKY LEAF

APPLE 
JUICE

LIPTON

TEA 
BAGS
TOTINO’S FROZEN

P i z z a s
Assorted K in d s    .................... Each

SHORTENING

J e w e l
42*oz. Can • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •

SHURFRESH 
Assorted Flavors

ICE MILK

CARROTS

4 1-Lb. s i 0 0
Bags g

U.S. NO. 1 SW EET

Potatoes

Shurfine Cut Green

Beans

49«
16-oz. Cans

3  F o r i

GALLON JUG

CLOROX BLEACH 
COFFEE FILTERS..... i o o - c t . B o x  7 9 ^
PURINA 0^  _  0 ^
PUPPY CHOW.............10-Lb. Bag O n 9 9
GEISHA CRUSHED
PINEAPPLE................. 20-oz.C an 9 9 ^
ZIP LOCK .  m 0 ^
FREEZER BAGS......  ...20-Ct. Box ■ a ■ 9

[ WELCH’S

STRAWBERRY 
PRESERVES 180z.Jar

$]̂ 59

DEL MONTE No. 2V2 Can

1 PEA0HE3 Sliced or Halves 8 5 «
SHURFINE

BARBECUE 
1 SAUCE i8 0 z . 6 9 «

SIX PACK

DR. PEPPER 120Z. ¥169

, axAM »^s J


