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Driver Education Course To Be 
Offered At Baird High School 
If you are going to be 15 years of age 
on or before April 1, 1999 and would 
like to take the Driver Education 
Course, please come by the Baird 
High School Office and sign up. Sign 
up deadline is December 15, 1998. 
The course cost will be: 
$150--Driving Only 
$175--Complete Course 

•••••••••••••• • •••••••••••••• 
KonczakPromotedTo Captain • • 

Baird Chamber of 
: Commerce News 

There is a new town 
in Texas, and we all 
can live there! The 
Library Development 
Division of the Texas 
State Library and 
Archives Commission 
has conceived a town 
where families read to-
gether. Welcome to 
Read, Texas! The TSL 
& Ac, in cooperation 
with the Callahan 
County Library, invite 
you and your family to 
read together through-
out this holiday season. 

During- the holidays, 
your family can: 

*Share a book for 
half an hour every 
evening (have family 
members take turns 
reading) 

*Read a book to 
someone as a holiday 
gift 

* Tell family stories 
and write them down 

*Share one book with 
a family member every 
week 	between 
Thanksgiving and 
New Year's 

When you share 
books: 

*Set aside a time 
each evening to share 
books together (even if 
each person reads their 
own books to them-
selves, everyone is still 
enjoying the experi-
ence together) 

Write a poem and 
win the $1,000 grand 
prize! 

Hollywood's Famous 
Poets Society is spon-
soring a new poetry 
contest, open to every-
one. There is no entry 
fee, and nothing to buy. 

To enter, send one 
poem on any subject 
and any style, 21 lines 
or less, to: Free Poetry 
Contest, 1626 N. Wilcox 
Ave., Suite 126, 
Hollywood, CA 90028. 
Or enter on-line, at 

*Set aside one room 
or area as "the reading 
space" 

*Make sure there are 
no noisy distractions 
(turn off the TV and 
stereo) 

*Talk about what 
you've read and share 
your ideas with others 

*Have fun! 
Tips for Reading 

Aloud 
When you read 

aloud to others, remem-
ber to: 

*Choose a book you 
really like 

*Practice by yourself 
first so you'll be famil-
iar with the book and 
the sound of your own 
voice reading aloud 

*Read with expres-
sion 

* Take your time and 
enjoy the story 

*Speak 	loudly 
enough so that everyone 
can hear you, but not so 
loudly it hurts your 
throat 

*Have a glass of 
water handy in case 
your throat gets dry or 
scratchy 

*Stop when your 
voice gets tired 

*Have fun! 
Read to your family, 

Read to a friend, Read 
to yourself, it all de-
pends on what you like 
best to do. 

WWW, famous poets. com 

"This is our big con-
test of the year," says 
Poetry Director Martha 
French. "We trust our 
prizes will encourage 
new poets to share their 
talent. We delight in 
discovering 	new 
poets." 

The deadline for en-
tering is January 15, 
1999. A winner's list 
will be sent to all en-
trants on or before 
March 31, 1999. 

Edward M. Konczak 
Jr. was recently pro-
moted to captain of the 
United States Army 
during ceremonies at 
Fort Hood, Texas. 

While a senior in 
high school, Konczak 
joined the U.S. Army 
Reserve 	2 4 4 th 
Psychological 
Operations Unit in 
Abilene as a Private E-
1. Upon graduation 
from Baird High 
School, he was entered 
into the Active Army 
Service and completed 
basic training at Ft. 
Leonard Wood, MO. 
and advanced individ-
ual training at Ft. Lee, 
VA. Upon completion, 
he was released from 
active duty and re-
turned to the 244th. 
While serving with the 
244th, he attained the 
rank of Sergeant E-5 
where he served as 
Speaker Team Leader. 

Konczak attended 
college at Tarleton 
State University. He 
served on the ROTC 
Battalion Staff 2 years 
and as Cadet Colonel 
Commanding the 
Texas Battallion at 
TSU his senior year. 
He was also selected to 
serve as Cadet Major 
during graduation cer-
emonies at ROTC 
Advanced Camp at Ft. 
Lewis, WA. Selected to 
receive a regular Army 
commission, he was 
commissioned 	a 
Second Lieutenant in 
the 	Military 
Intelligence Corps and 
graduated from TSU in 
the spring of 1994 with a 
Bachelor of Science 
Degree. 

Assigned to Ft. 

Huachuca, AZ, he at-
tended the military 

41=PIONNIMIM 21.-'1111, 	 

Intelligence Officers 
Basic Course. After a 
short assignment to Ft. 
Benning, GA to attend 
the Army Airborne 
school, he was assigned 
to Ft. Hood, TX. 

While at Ft. Hood, he 
served as Tactical 
Intelligence Officer for 
the 3rd Battalion, 66th 
Armored Regiment, 
2nd Armor Div.; 
Platoon Leader and 
Executive Officer for 
Delta Company, 104 
Military Intelligence 
Battalion, 4th Infantry 
Div.; and as the G-2 
Operations Officer for 
the 4th Infantry 
Division General 
Staff. Konczak was 
also deployed to Europe 
in support of Operation 
Joint Guard in 1997-98. 

Cpt. Konczak is 
presently stationed at 
Ft. Benning, GA at-
tending the Infantry 
Officers Advanced 
Course. His awards in-
clude the Army Service 
Ribbon, National 
Defense 	Service 
Ribbon, 	Non 
Commissioned Officer 
Professional 
Development Ribbon, 
Army 	Reserve 
Component 
Achievement Medal, 
Army Achievement 
Medal with Oak Leaf 
Cluster, Joint Service 
Achievement Medal, 
Army Commendation 
Medal, and Army 
Parachutist Badge. 

Cpt. Konczak and 
his wife, Amy and 
sons, Eddie, Mike and 
Brandon, live on Post 
at Ft. Benning, GA. He 
is the son of Cpt. Mike 
Konczak TSG Retired 
and Sandra Konczak 
and the grandson of 
Eddie and Ovena 
Konczak, all of Baird. 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 

Baird Chamber of 
Commerce will be host-
ing its second sweet 
meet 	baking 
contest/sale on Friday, 
December 18th at First 
National Bank. Once 
again entries in four 
categories including 
cakes, pies, breads and 
miscellaneous (cook-
ies, candies) will be 
judged for appearance, 
originality, and pre-
sentation. Entries 
should be brought to the 
bank between 9:00 and 
10:00 a.m. 

Last week's Old 
Fashioned Christmas 
was a whopping suc-
cess. Lots of special 
thanks for the efforts 
responsible for that suc-
cess go to Joann Vestal 
for coordinating the 
beautiful Nativity, Rev. 
Ross Ellis, soloist, and 
for the Sound System; 
Sharon 	Walker, 
soloist; all the back-
ground singers and 
children who partici-
pated. 

First National Bank 
sponsored the Cooper 
Fiddlers, 	Hugh 
Shrader, James Grant 
and Steve Bowen han-
dled the mini train du-
ties. As usual Lyman 
Brigham did a wonder-
ful job as Santa's es- 

• 
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cort, and entertained 
everyone with the 
buggy rides. The 4-H 
Club and First Baptist 
Church Choirs did a 
great job, LaVerne 
Rutherford, Ruth 
Fisher, Janis Stout and 
Pat Loyd were in 
charge of the refresh-
ments; film for the 
Santa pictures was do-
nated by Bill Faircloth 
at State Farm 
Insurance in Clyde. 

First National Bank 
and 	Hanner 
Dealership donated the 
Teddy Bears and 
Grumpe's Specialties 
donated the candy for 
the kids. Janice Grant, 
Jack and Darlene King 
and Bobby Jones deco-
rated the Arches. Tom 
and Sharon Walker 
did the photography. A 
very special thanks to 
Monty Howard who 
served as Santa's 
helper and K.D. 
Griffin who provided 
the perfect setting for 
the festivities. Homes 
tour hostesses Pat 
Holland, Sandy Toy, 
Rhonda Vestal, Anna 
Mendez, Susan McCool 
and Tommie Jones did 
a super job. 

Thanks to Jerry 
Loper who is the most 
recent contributor to the 

11-29-98 to 12-05-98, 
CASES INVESTI-

GATED  
Warnings--107 
Complaints--82 
ACCIDENTS 
There were 2 acci-

dents investigated dur-
ing this time span. 

PEOPLE ARREST-
ED ON OUTSTAND-
ING WARRANT c 

2 for a 	 00 
collected. 

Door prizes were do-
nated by Pat Loyd, 
Henson's Antiques, 
Shipp's Marketplace, 
Baggage 	House 
Restaurant, Flashback, 
Cowboy Gallery and 
Framing, The Old 

BAIRD 
The Antique Market 

334 Market Baird 
915-854-1997 
Collectibles 

Antique Memories 
304 Market Baird 

915-854-2021 
Architectual 

Barbara's Country 
Tyme 

300 Market Baird 
915-854-2424 

Glassware 
Callahan Co. 
Collectibles 
2nd Baird 

915-854-1782 
Coins 

Creation By Collene 
331 Market Baird 

915-854-5980 
Collectibles 

Em's Eats, Sweets, 
Antiques 

140 Market Baird 
915-854-59$6 

Period Furniture 
Etheredge Antiques 
132 East 3rd Baird 

915-854-1409 
Furniture 

Flashback 
234 Market Baird 

915-854-1410 
Advertising signs, 

Memorabilia 
Henson's Antiques 
230 Market Baird 

915-854-1756 
American, Victorian 

Furniture 
Hughes Trading Co. 
743 West 4th Baird 

915-854-1714 
Bottles 

Market Street Mall 
212 Market Baird 

915-854-1408 
Antiques 

Morgan Bargain Barn 
108 Market Baird 

915-854-1947 
Collectibles 

Odd's And End's 
344 Market Baird 

915-854-5958 
Collectibles 

The Old Shoppe 
312 Market Baird 

915-854-1911 
Antique Mall 
Collectibles 

Plaza Corner 
245 Market Baird 

915-854-5972 
Restored Wood Burning 

Stoves 
Primrose Lane 

Antiques 
203 Market Baird 

915-854-5936 
Bible Books/Gifts 

Shoppe, Em's Sweets, 
Eats and Antiques. 

The Community 
Bulletin Board needs 
some new magnetic let-
ters. Any donations to-
ward that effort would 
be appreciated. 

Trail's End 
223 Market Baird 

915-854-2594 
Western Indian Items 

Upstairs Shoppe 
3rd Baird 

915-854-2424 

Sporting Collectibles 

CLYDE 
AAA Antiques 

Clyde 
915-893-2705 

Appraisal/Auction 
Livery Stable 

132 Market Baird 
915-893-2595 

Horse Drawn Carragies 

CISCO 
Past Times Antiques 
600 C. Hilton Cisco 

254-442-2486 
Antique Furniture, 

Collectibles 

EASTLAIVD 
Antiques & Uniques 

116 W. Commerce 
Eastland 

254-629-1889 
Coke Collectibles 
Kountry Korner 

112 S. Seaman Eastland 
254-629-2214 

General Antiques 
Hogs N' Clover 

108 W. Commerce 
Eastland 

254-629-2755 
Ty, Ganz Collectibles 

Commerce Street 
Warehouse 
Flea Market 

307 E. Commerce 
Eastland 

254-629-3199 
General 

Thmbleweed 
112 W. Commerce 

Eastland 
254-629-8721 

Gifts & Antiques 
House of Antiques 

908 S. Bassett 
Eastland 

254-629-11,24 
Antiques & Collectibles 

S & K Sales 
515 E. Main Eastland 

254-629-8382 
Ken Bullard 

RANGER 
Out Of The Past 

123 N. Rusk Ranger 
254-647-3551 

Antiques 
RISING STAR 

Something Old, 
Something New 

Main Street 
General Antiques 

Hard Times Antiques 
Rising Star 

'BigDurnpsterForCleanup" 
The "Big Dumpster for Cleanup" will be 
at the City Barn, located at 233 East 2nd, 
the week of December 14th-19th. 
Hours will be; 
Monday-Friday---8:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m. 
Saturday 	8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
The City of Baird will have the dumpster 
tour times a years for a WEEK each time. 
We will announce the date in the papter. 
The dumpster is for City of Baird, 
residents ONLY! m"  

Callahan County 
Library News 

A Call For Poems 

Edward Konczak Jr promoted to Captain 

Christmas holiday, the 
First National Bank of 
Baird will close early, 
12:00 p.m., Thursday, 
December 24, 1998. The 
bank will be closed all 

°kit %lief  cleiiirehakille, 

g MO4e 854-5999 

244 Market Street • Baird. TX 79504 • 854-1295 

First  National Bank 
Baird 

&4  Co pt.bu gince 1885 

IMMO,  MINIMMILt ‘1.0111=0MMINIMMW 	  

lighting fund. 

Christmas Lighting Contest 
To Be Held In December 

The Baird Chamber 	There will be 1st, 
of Commerce will be 2nd, and 3rd place 
sponsoring 	a prizes for the residen - 
Christmas Lighting tial category. And for 
Contest on December the business category, 
15. Anyone outside the there will be 1st and 
town proper interested 2nd place prizes. 
in entering this contest 	Prizes are: 
please contact Jane 	1st place--Large 
Robbins at 854-2456; Fruit Basket 
Yvonne Baron at 854- 	2nd place--Medium 
1207; Janet Burks at Fruit Basket 
854-1865; or Billie 	3rd place--Small 
Unrien at 854-1094. 	Fruit Basket 

Bank To Close 
Early For Holdays 

In observance of the 	day Friday, December 
25, 1998. 

Regular business 
hours will resume 
Monday, December 28, 
1998. We hope everyone 
has a safe and happy 
holiday. 

GUIDE 
Start at either end or in the middle 

AND DO 'EM ALL! 



Arts  2:fp 38 HAVE 	Acta 2:38  

IN GOD 
FOR 
HEALING 

FOR 
SALVATION 

FOR 
FINANCES 

Acts 2:38-The original New Testament Plan of Salvation 

FIRST PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
Sunday 10:00 a.m. Wednesday 7:00 p.m. 

311 S Lamar - Eastland, TX 76448 
"A NEW BEGINNING" 
Promise Keepers Welcome 

4104 

• A 

be $1.50 for adults. Jill Jackson's 

HOLLYWOOD Moran News 
by Mrs. Luke Huskey 

HOLLYWOOD ... AND 
THE GOOD NEWS IS! —
Richard Gere and Julia 
Roberts will have a go at it 

Cisco Press - Eastland Telegram - Ranger Times - Rising Star - Callahan County Star 
The Moran school 

students will be out on 
Thursday, Dec. 17th for 
the Christmas holiday. 
The school Christmas 
dinner 	will 	be 
Wednesday, Dec. 16th. 
The public is invited to 
have lunch for or with 
the school. The cost will 

would be welcomed. A 
first freeze is predicted 
for Monday night. Can 
you imagine lawn 
mowers being used in 
December, but some 
lawns were being 
mowed the past week. 

McKinney, Eve Par-
rish, Jean Tabor and 
Gladys Matthews. 
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Woman" as the hotel man-
ager, also joins the cast as 
Gem's best friend. Garry 
Marshall directs and all 
concerned are expecting 
"Runaway Bride" to run 
away at the box office. 

Aside to Kathryn K. of 
Santa Rosa, Calif.: Indeed, 
they are NOT feuding. The 
Tilly sisters, Meg and 
Jennifer are very close. 
Matter of fact, they were 
just recently seen together at 
the preem screening and 
party celebrating the 15th 
anniversary of "The Big 
Chill." 

Bet your bippy Oprah's 
name will be right up there 
when all kinds of nomina-
tions roll around. For 
actress in "Beloved" and for 
the picture. I thought every- 

again in a film titled 
"Runaway Bride." Gere 
plays a hard-nosed reporter 
who writes an article about 
a woman who leaves three 
grooms at the altar. Julia is 
that woman. Hector 
Elizondo, so good with 
Gere and Roberts on "Pretty 

EARLY TRAILER SALES 
901 Early Blvd. 

Early, Texas 
915-646-2022 

915-646-8003 Ni • hts 

A Santa Claus helper 
appeared at .the Legion 
and Auxiliary Christ-
mas supper Saturday at 
the American Legion 
Hall in Moran, follow-
ing a delicious meal of 
covered dish. Thirty 
two attended the affair. 
Santa's helpers gave 
out gifts from a beauti-
fully lighted Christmas 
tree. Mary Edwards 
gave the blessing for 
the meal. Betty Nic-
hols, Auxiliary presi-
dent, welcomed those 
present and wished all 
a very Merry Christ-
mas. Mary Edwards 
presented Maurice 
Snyder and Elma May 
Huskey life member-
ship cards from the 
Auxiliary. Mrs. Sny-
der and Mrs. Huskey 
have been members of 
the Auxiliary for 50 
years. 

There has been a 
change in the tempera-
ture in Moran. So win-
ter is on its way. 

A light mist of rain 
was falling Monday 
morning and it was 
cloudy. A good rain Bobby Guy Thom-

ason, 58, of Lovington, 
New Mexico and for-
merly of Moran, Texas, 
died Friday, Nov. 27, 
1998 at a Lubbock hospi-
tal after a sudden ill-
ness. 

Mr. Thomason was 
born in Moran, Texas 
on Dec. 5, 1939 and 
graduated from Moran 
High School. He mar-
ried Sheryl Goodwin in 
1979 and was a self-em-
ployed businessman in 
Lovington. He attended 
the Church of Christ. 

Survivors include 
his wife of Lovington, 
N.M.; his mother, 
Bessie Thomason of 
Eastland; his brother, 
Dale Thomason of 
Andrews, TX.; his sis-
ter, Shirley Laflamme 
of Glendale, AZ.; and 
two nieces and one 
nephew. 

He was preceded in 
death by his father, 
Othal Guy Thomason. 

All Size Utility Stock
egt. & Goosenecks Available  

-,Enrc°   

Funeral for Jim 
Howard, 96, was held 
Sunday at 2 p.m. in the 
First Baptist Church in 
Moran with Rev. Cole 
Farmer and Rev. Jack 
Clack officiating, di-
rected by Godfrey-
Neese Funeral Home. 

Mr. Howard passed 
away Thursday night 
at the Eastland Hos-
pital. 

He was a member of 
the Baptist Church, the 
Masonic Lodge No. 863, 
and Eastern Star 
Chapter 591, both in 
Moran. He was retired 
from the Lone Star Gas 
Co. He is survived by 
one daughter, Mrs. 
Winnie Kirstwell of 
Athens; two sons, Paul 
Howard of Monahans 
and William Howard 
of Possum Kingdom 
Lake; three sisters; one 
brother; grandchil-
dren; great-grandchil-
dren; and one great-
great-grandchild. 

Burial was in the 
Moran Cemetery. 
Grandsons were pall-
bearers. 

0 

#°.Wer.Met Wallarectes 

(800) 700-7044 
Hwy 377 South 

Stephenville 

Have you driven 
around town and 
viewed the Christmas 
decorations and lights. 
People are beginning to 
get in the Christmas 
spirit with all the going 
and coming that is in 
line with the season. If 
you plan to be driving 
during the Christmas 
and New Year's holi-
days, drive carefully 
and be safe. Your corre-
spondent wishes that 
you have a very Merry 
Christmas and a won-
derful New Year. 

Stephenville 

Pipe 

Steel 

Tumbleweed 

Materials for Metal Buildings, Steel Fence, Construction Pipe 23/8" &27/8° 

Angles - 20' Long Square Tubing 
20'& 24'114ga. 

I" 	 $ 31/ft 
11/4" sq 	$ .38/ft. 
I 1/2" sq... 	$ .44/ft 

C-Purlins, 14 ga. 
Primed 

1" x I" x 3/16 	 .39/ft. 
I Ur x I I/2" x3/16 	S .54/11 

2" x 2" x 3/16 	$ 69/it 
3" x 3" x 3/16 	51.2241. 

4. 	 $ .58/ft. 
6" 	 $ .76/ft. 
8" 	 $ .99/ft. 
10" 	 $1.28/ft 

1 1/4" 	Black Pipe 
21' Length $ 0 89/ft 

1/4" New Galv. Cable 
$.13/ft 2500' Spool 

Don Settle of Abilene 
was greeting friends in 
Moran, Sunday and at-
tended the funeral for 
Jim Howard. Don is a 
former manager of the 
West Texas Utilities of-
fice in Moran and is 
now retired. 

Pre Cut 2 7/8" x 8' Pipe 
Post $ 8.65 ea.  

i

112 W. Commerce Eastland 

Gifts, Jewlery, Gourmet Items, Candles, 
Cookbooks, Crafts, Antiques, Collectibles, 

Quilts, Memory Boxes, Floral, 
Gift Baskets and much, much more. 

Lots of exciting gifts for everyone on your list. 

N 	Open 9:30 - 6:00 Mon.-Sat. , 

....„... .Lstayaway, Gift Certificates 
Available 	...0 

Delivery Available 

Also Channel. Flat 
Straps. I-Beams, Doors & 

Door Frames. Paint & 
Primer plus Welding 

Supplies 

Thursday, December 10, 1998 
one knew all about her, but 
for those of you who've 
asked, she started her career 
at 19 when she became the 
youngest and the first 
African-American woman 
ever to anchor the news at 
Nashville's WTVF-TV. 
Later, she moved to 
Baltimore to co-anchor a 
news and talk show. Still 
later, she moved to Chicago 
and the Oprah Winfrey 
Show. The rest is history. 

BITS 'N' PIECES: 
Jennifer Grant, daughter 
of Cary Grant and Dyan 
Cannon at "The Big Chill" 
anniversary party. Her face 
a combination of Mom and 
Dad ... At that same party, 
Glenn Close sporting a 
most becoming new hairdo 

Ossie Davis and Ruby 
Dee celebrate their 111;11-
ETH! wedding anniversary 
on December 15th by join-
ing the likes of Bill Cosby, 
Harry Belafonte, Sidney 
Poitier, Lena Horne and on 
and on at a New York gala 
to raise funds for communi-
ty theaters. Of course, 
everyone will tilt a toast to 
these two. How many 
famous couples can you 
name who have chalked up 
50 YEARS of togetherness? 

Are you a "Hogan's 
Heroes" fan? New paper-
back (Renaissance Books) 
on the stands titled 
"Hogan's Heroes: Behind 
the Scenes at Stalag 13!" by 
Brenda Scott Royce with a 
foreword by Werner 
Klemperer who played 
Colonel Klink 	Viscount 
and Viscountess David 
Linley, one of the hand-
somest couples on the dance 
floor at the Marvin Davis' 
annual Carousel of Hope 
Ball. Name sound familiar? 
He's the son of Princess 
Margaret and Lord 

Snowdon ... L.A. music 
lovers glowing over the new 
head of the L.A. Opera Co. 
Placido Domingo takes 
over in 2000. (I can't 
believe it. Everytime I write 
that number. Awesome!) ... 
So sad about Carrie Fisher. 
With all her talent, she can't 
seem to control addiction. 
This time she has checked 
herself into a detox program 
after pain medication for 
dental implants ... Aside to 
Rosalie T. of Trenton, NJ.: 
Patience. You'll be seeing 
Armand Assante in "The 
Chameleon." It's a cop 
thriller co-starring Gary 
Busey. And yes. I do agree 
with you. Assante is "tres 
sexeee" ... Jane Seymour 
is one of the best-dressed 
actresses in this town. no 
matter where she goes, she's 
ever the star and stunningly 
gowned ... I'm a great Bai 
Ling fan, but speaking of 
dressing, she looked ridicu-
lous at a recent do. The tiny 
Chinese star wore wedgies 
at least five inches in height, 
a spaghetti strap black top 
separated about an inch 
from a butt-hugging black 
skin about four inches 
above her knees. Quelle 
flop! ... Richard Dreyfuss 
is quite a reader. I see him 
often at a bookstore in the 
San Fernando Valley. His 
next will be "Peppermint 
Lounge" about two boy-
hood friends, now ex-cops, 
who get involved in a get-
rich-quick scheme that 
doesn't exactly pan out. 
Here's an actor who never 
stops working, and has 
made the transition from 
young leading man most 
gracefully. 

© 1998 King Features Synd..  

Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Kays and C.L. 
Miller were in Waco 
last week. Mt Kays 
and Mr. Miller attend-
ed the Masonic Grand 
Lodge meeting. 

Custom Handmade Hats 
Complete Renovations 

ustorn eotAer 8,00as 
* tracelets 	 * 8elts 
* Nec449,9As 	 * kat &Inas 

712 - A Butternut Abilene, Texas 673.9000 ' Open Tues. - Sat. 9:00 a.m.-5:30 p.m. 

The Dorcas Sunday 
School class met in the 
home of Mrs. Dale 
Pippen last Thursday 
for the class Christmas 
dinner. Ruel Tabor 
gave the blessing. 
Mozelle Harper, presi-
dent, presided over the 
business session and 
brought a devotional on 
Christmas. Mrs. Mau-
rice Snyder read the 
minutes of the last 
meeting and gave the 
treasurer's report. The 
December project was 
discussed. The group 
sand Christmas carols. 

Other members pre-
sent were Mrs. Hazel 

Carpet • Linoleum • Tile 
Ceramic Tile • Wood Flooring 

Wallpaper • Mini Blinds 

Clean 
Your Yard 
Up With 
Our New 
Stump 
Grinder fr  CANS 14)  	

CARPET! CARPET! CARPET! 
AWAASS:.. 

Choose your carpet from 
over 1,000 samples and 
have it installed by our 

trained in-house installers. 

Get that 
custom 

finished look 
with matching 
wallpaper and 
custom fitted 
mini-blinds 

No Application Fees & No Government Red Tape $100 Total 
Closing Costs Upon Loan Approval, Up To $50,000 Loan 

T. 1 CLARK CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 
(254) 734-2755 

P.O. Box 176 - 111 E. Roberts St. 
Gorman, TX 76454 

Now 
Available 
To Rent 

At: 

Grandpaw's 
Tool Shed 

1304 E. Main 
Eastland 

L 629-3363 

General Building Contractors - All Work Guaranteed 
Custom Homes - Remodeling - Commercial - Industrial - Farm 

Financing - Free Estimates - Design, 
Engineering & Plan Services 

5-101 

k,\ 
X.:NNNSWN NNNNVINC,Xci9NWNNNS.NNONN•NNTWN\NW•NNWN WTN\ NWNWTNANNSW•• • • t . . -...N..-isw..N4NP.XN.N.4.14.‘,XlNsIMNC,N,NNVNNVQ,NNNW.SONVANN44NWAVOwAN 

12 month/ 
12,000 mile 
Nationwide 

Warranty 

All Transmission & CV Joint Services 



Attend Church Regularly 
cfittzcfi 

izEcLoT9  .......and read your Bible daily 

Caffahan County Star 

:1-!ri"i1T-Frjrilt-7-71:1-155,11E-711-' .11 L 	— 11.1 .11 	I:21.11 r-Li.ii_11 • uri2 11 c-mi. 

CLYDE CHURCH 
OF CHRIST 

Jim Hall, Minister 
So. 4th & Austin 

893-4723 
Bible Class, 10:00 a.m.; Sun- 
day worship, 10:55 a.m.; Sun- 
day evening worship, 6:00p.m.; 
Wednesday evenings, 7:00 p.m. 

AREA CHURCHES 

OPLIN BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Riley Fugitt, Pastor 
Sunday School, 10:00 am.; 
Sunday morning worship, 11:00 
a.m.; Sunday evening,5:00 
Wednesday evening, 6:00 p.m. 

Classical Chorus OfAbilene Presents 
"A Christmas Celebration" 

One week before 
Christmas and the kids 
are out of school, fami-
ly and friends are com-
ing in for the holidays, 
you're looking for 
Christmas entertain-
ment but all the 
Christmas programs 
were done in the first 
two weeks of December 
and now you have no 
where to go to fan the 
embers of Christmas 
excitement to flame. Or 
is there something 
more? Now in there 9th 
choral season, the 
Classical Chorus of 
Abilene presents a "A 
Christm as 
Celebration" featuring 
over 100 children on 
stage in the Classical 
Youth 	Chorus, 
Classical Children's 
Chorus, Classical 
Adult Chorus, select en-
sembles, and harpist 
Carol Reid. Come and 
join us for an evening 
of tradition and family 
entertainment. 

Carol Reid will per-
form a medley of tradi-
tional pieces from the 
"Ceremony of Carols" 
by Benjamin Britten as 
well as "Fantasia" on a 
theme for harp by 
Haydn. The Youth 
Chorus will also per-
form "Ceremony of 
Carol" with harp ac-
companiment. The 
Children's Chorus will 
perform 	Panis 
Angelicus by Cesar 
Franck featuring local 
Tenor soloist, Richard 
Burke. 

The concert is set for 
Saturday, December 
19th, 7:30 p.m. at the 
Abilene Civic Center. 
All tickets are $10 and 
can be obtained in the 
Classical Chorus 
Office located at 451 
Pine Street, Suite 410, 
by calling 676-4100, 
Civic Center Box Office 
December 18th 12-5:00 
p.m., December 19th 1-5 
p.m., or at the door. 
Mastercard and Visa 
are accepted. 

Free Poetry Contest 

.r*  • 	• 	' 	' ' 

Remember to: 
Renew your 
Subscription 

Carpenter Chiropractic Clinic 
Dr. Jim Carpenter 

Open: 
Monday & Friday 9:00-12:00, 1:30-5:00 

Saturdays By Appointment 

(254) 643-3101 

512 W. College Rising Star 
(Located in the old Rising Star Hospital) 

B52 

Since 1885, First National Bank of Baird 
and it's team of Personal Bankers have 
been financing your dreams. It is 
important to bankers, like 1.T. Myers, to 
know the banking needs of each customer. 
Stop by today and see what LT. can (10 for 
you. 

Firs t National Bank 
Baird 

   

244 Market Street 
Baird, Texas 79504 

915/854-1295 
• • 

IODIC  

    

Your Personal Banker 

The Pit to Restaurant 
114 E. 6th Cisco- 442-1060 	• 

'This Week's Special.  - - Servedftom 2-9 PM :1 

Grilled Pork Chops $495 
Choice of Fries or Bake and Salad Bar 	 Plus Tax 

M 

Homemade Stew, Chili, m  
M 

or Chicken & Dumplings 
$300 m 

m 
Plus Tax 14 . y Book Your Ch-itTnas Party to 	m 

0..............................................m 

J.T. Myers 
Vice President 

COTTONWOOD BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Knox Waggoner, Pastor 
Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.:Wor- 
ship, 11:00 a.m.; Choir practice 
6:00 p.m.; Sunday evening 7:00 
p.m.; Wednesday, 7:00 p.m. 

Itui 	WI I 

01' 	V 

0 

k  • ,141, 

- 

Law Office of 
Robert E. McCool 

235 Market Baird, Tx 
854-1016  

BI-RITE AUTO 
4 bik E of light Cross Plains 725-7361 

Closed Fridays - Open Saturday 9-4 

AUTOS - ETC, 
90 Cadillac Seville 4 dr., super nice 	Special $4250 
88 Lincoln Continental 6,000 on new engine, 

very nice 	 $3500 
86 Lincoln Towncar carriage roof, exc. cond 	$2150 
83 Cadillac Fleetwood Brougham DeElegance 4 dr., 

super nice inside & out 	 $1750 
87 Ford Taurus GL 4 dr 	 $350 Down 

PICKUPS 
92 Ford F350 Crew Cab dually, 7.3 diesel, 5 sp. .$7750 
90 Ford F350 Crew Cab dually, 7.3 diesel, 5 sp., 

customized inside & out, lots a chrome & alum. special 
paint and more 	 $8750 

91 Ford F150 6 cyl., 5 sp., looks runs great 	$3750 
91 Chevy 1 Ton Crew Cab diesel, automatic, flat bed runs 

& drives very good 	 $4500 
86 Ford F350 Diesel Dural rears, flat bed 	$2250 
71 Ford F250 6 cyl 	 $350 Down 

MISC, 
Tow Dolly 650 
91 Ford 5.0 V8 engine, low miles, complete 	$750 
Ford & 78 to 91 Lincoln Body Parts. 6.9 Diesel Engine. 

SOME FINANCING AVAILABLE 
Notice -Open Mon.-Tues. & Thurs. 9-2 
Open Wed. & Sat. 9-4, Closed Friday 

The Star 
Callahan County's Paper Says 

First National Bank of Baird 

244 Market Baird, TX 
854-1295 

Metal Mart 
1-20 East at the Cherry Lane Exit 

1-800-677-2502 
Rick & Dianne Jones - Managers 

Brownwood Television Cable Service 
1-800-527-2576 

And we know that all things worktogether for good to them that love God, 
to them who are the called according to His purpose. Romans 828 

*God Bless You" 

SHOP AT HOME FIRST , 

Remember To Renew 
Your 

Subscription 

Robert E. McCool 
Attorney A t Law 

235 Market Street 
Baird, Texas 

79504 

(915) 854-1016 
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BAIRD 
CHURCHES  

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Race and Third 

Don Willaford, Interim Pastor 
Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; 
Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Disci-
pleship Training, 6:00 p.m.; 
Evening Worship, 6:00 p.m. 

- - - 
FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 

CHURCH 
Fourth and Chestnut 

Dr. Richard Wood , Pastor 
Sunday School, 9:00 a.m.; Pub- 
lic Worship, 10:00 a.m. 

CHURCH OF GOD 
Thelma Dr. and W. Hwy 80 
Rev. James Radford, Pastor 

Sunday: Sunday School, 10:00 
a.m.; Morning Worship, 11:00 
a.m.; Evening Worship, 6:00 
p.m. 
Thursday: Bible Study, 6:30p.m. 

BAIRD CHURCH' 
OF CHRIST 

1-20 and FM 2047 
Bob Sweeten, Minister 

Sunday: Bible Classes, 10:00 
am.; Worship & Communion, 
10:45 a.m.; Singing 5:30 p.m.; 
Evening Worship, 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday: Ladies Bible Class, 
9:30 am. M id-Week B ible Class, 
7:00 p.m. 

FIRST 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Hwy 283 
Pastor - Ricky Carstensen 

Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11:00 a.m.; 
Youth Group 5:00 p.m.; Eve-
ning. Worship 7:00 p.m., 7:00 
p.m. Wednesday: Youth Meet-
ing, 7:30 p.m. 
Holy Conununionev el),  1st S tin-
day at 11:00 a.m. 
Methodist Services at Golden 
Holiday Care Center, 3:00 p.m. 
every 1st Sunday. 

CLYDE 
CHURCHES  

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF 
GOD CHURCH 

S. Access Rd., Off 1-20, 
893-5208 

Charles Morgan, Pastor 
Sunday School, 9:45; Sunday 
morning worship, 11:00 a.m.; 
Sunday evening worship, 6:00 
p.m.; Wednesday night, 7:00 
p.m. 

- - - 
FIRST UNITED 

METHODIST CHURCH 
217 Oak St. 
893-4923 

David Edwards, Pastor 
Worship Service, 8:30 a.m.; 
Fellowship: Coffee & donuts, 
9:30 a.m.; Sunday School, 9:45 
a.m.; Worship Service, 10:50 
a.m.; Jr. High Youth, 5:30 p.m.; 
Evening Worship, 6:00 p.m.; Sr. 
High Youth, 7:00 p.m.; Tues. 
9:30 a.m. prayer group; Wed-
nesday: Choirs (all ages); Wed-
nesday night, Bible Studies. 

SOUTHSIDE BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Ronnie Timms, Pastor 
S. 604 California 

893-4611 
Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; Sun-
day morning worship, 11:00 
am.; Sunday evening worship, 
6:00 p.m.; Wednesday night, 
7:00 p.m. 

APOSTOLIC UNITED 
PENECOSTAL CHURCH 

So. First & Marion 
893-4.874 

Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Worship 11:00 a.m.; Prayer and 
praise, 7:00 p.m.; Wednesday 
evening, 7:30 p.m. 

- - - 
ST. JOACHIM & ANN 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Cherry 
Priest, Father Bob Bush 

Sunday Mass: 8:00 a.m. 
- - - 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
OF CLYDE 

So. 3rd & Austin 
893-5815 

Jerry Joplin, Pastor 
Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; Sun-
day morning worship, 11:00 
a.m.; Sunday evening worship, 
7:00 p.m.; Wednesday Prayer, 
7:15 p.m. 

- - - 
NORTHSIDE CHURCH OF 

CHRIST 
No. 5th & Plum 

Sunday Morning Service, 10:30 
am.; Sunday evening service, 
6:00 p.m. 

HWY 36 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
12 miles-SE of Abilene 

on Hwy 36 
529-3818 

Ed Headrick, Minister 
Bible School, 10:00 a.m.; Sun-
day Morning, 11:00 a.m.; Sun-
day evening, 6:30 p.m.; Wed-
nesday Evening, 7:30 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
OF EULA 
529-3768 

Johnny Hailes, Pastor 
Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; Sun-
day morning worship, 10:55 
a.m.;DiscipleshipTraining, 5:00 
p.m.; Sunday evening worship, 
6:00 p.m.; Wednesday Prayer, 
7:15 p.m. 

- - - 
CHERRY HEIGHTS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
N. 4th & Cherry Ln. 

893-5630 
Jimmy Davis, Pastor 

Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; Sun-
day morning worship, 11:00 
a.m.; Sunday evening worship, 
7:00 p.m.; Wednesday night, 
7:00 p.m. 

- - - 
NEW HOPE 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
No. First & Pine 

893-2783 
Sunday Morning service, 10:30 
a.m.; Sunday evening, 6:00 p.m. 

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
South 604 
893-5851 

David McGraw, Pastor 
Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Sunday morning worship.11:00 
a.m.; Sunday Eve worship, 6:00 
p.m.; Wednesday Night, 7:00 
p.m. 

- - - 
TRINITY 

COMMUNITY CHURCH 
North First & Cedar 

893-4438 
Sam Nichols, Pastor 

Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; Sun-
day morning worship, 10:45 
a.m.; Sunday evening worship, 
7:00 p.m.; Wednesday night 
7:00 p.m. 

EULA UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

529-4241 
John Bill Hedrick, Pastor 

Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; Sun-
day morning worship, 10:50 
a.m.; Sunday evening worship, 
6:00 p.m.; Youth Fellowship, 
7:00 p.m.; Wednesday Bible 
Study, 7:00 p.m. 

- . 

(Baird 
Menu  

WEEK OF 
DECEMBER 14-17 
BREAKFAST 
MONDAY 
Donuts 
Toast 
Juice 
Milk 
TUESDAY 
Cheese Mast 
Applesauce 
Milk 
WEDNESDAY 
Ceteal 
Toast 
Raisins 
Milk 
THURSDAY 
Pancakes 
Juice 
Milk 
FRIDAY 
Holiday 
LUNCH 
MONDAY 
Frito Pie 
Tossed Salad 
Cornbread 
Fruit 
Milk 
TUESDAY 
Turkey w/Dressing 
Mashed Potatoes 
Green Beans 
Light Bread 
Cranberry Sauce 
Ice Cream 
Milk 
WEDNESDAY 
Chicken Pot Pie 
Tossed Salad 
Jello 
Milk 
THURSDAY 
Hot Dogs 
French Fries 
Cobbler 
Milk 
FRIDAY 
Holiday 

(c  Poet's 
Corner 
by Susie Wylie 

I'll do my best, Lord 
you do the rest 

I want to be ready 
when You call 

I'll pray for the one's 
You lay on my heart 

Lord what else can I 
do to have a closer walk 
with You 

Nothing I do is for 
myself 

It's for God, nothing 
else 

There's so many 
things I want to do 

But Lord I can do 
nothing without You 

I know You are 
walking by my side 

And will gently lead 
me through my trials 

I'll give You the 
glory and all the praise 

I'll never forget the 
day I was saved 

There I find perfect 
peace 

Where joy never 
ceases. 

KEEP RECYCLING I 
WORKING: 

JOIN, 

RECYCLING 
1 I COALITION 

of TEXAS 
1-888-258-3404 (00 frve) 

www.recycletx.org 

FIRE1 

IS SERIOUS 
PREVENTION 

BUSINESS 

The Bards of (beauti-
fuldowntown) 
Burbank, one of 
America's foremost po-
etry societies, is at it 
once again. As an an-
nual tribute to the muse 
of poetry, they are spon-
soring a free poetry 
contest. The deadline 
for entering is 
December 18, 1998. 

To enter send one 
poem on any subject, 
using any style, 21 
lines or less to: Free 

Poetry Contest, 2219 W 
Olive Ave., Suite 250, 
Burbank, CA 91506, or 
enter on-line w-
ww.freecontest.corn. 

"Our contest is open 
to everyone who has 
ever written a poem," 
says Poetry Director 
Dr. Kevin Scribner. 
" We especially encour-
age undiscovered tal-
ent and to this end we 
are offering a whop-
ping $1,000 grand 
prize." 

• I: 



A Moment Of Truth 
Abortion is the human 

sacrafice of life for the devil's 
religion of Humanism. 

It seems like the religion of Humanism 
has taken over our Federal Government, 

the National Media and the Public 
Schools and Colleges. 

If you would like to help sponsor this 
MOMENT OF TRUTH in this and other 

newspapers please contact: 
Prayers For America, Cliff Lindsay, 

254-647-1300, P. 0. Box 432, 
Ranger, TX 76470 _ 21116:,  

-••-••-••-••"••-••-•••`•••••• •••••••••••••••••■•••••••••11W••••••••••••••-•• -̂•"-.- 
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Thursday, December 10, 1998 
Callahan County Sta r 

Classifieds 
Classified Rate' 

1st run...$3.00 up to 25 words 
Over 25 words...ist per word 

	$1.50 
$7.50 

Deadlines  
5 PM Mondays 
915-854-1008 

FAX 254-629-2092 

2nd run 
Monthly run 

Milk 
THURSDAY 
German Sausage 
Potato Salad 
Wheat Bread 
Orange Slices 
Milk 
FRIDAY 
Beef Tips 
Gravy 
Rice 
Green Beans 
Apricots 
Milk 
SNACK 
MONDAY 
Apple Slices 
Milk 
TUESDAY 
Sundae 
Milk 
WEDNESDAY 
Apple Juice 
Carrot Sticks 
THURSDAY 
Cinnamon Toast 
Milk 
FRIDAY 
Pineapple/Orange 

Juice 
Banana Muffins 

Mobiles Help Wanted For Sale Real Estate Don't Trade It - Donate It! 
Receive a Potential Tax Break 

O Donate your used car, truck or boat. 
O Receive a valuable tax deduction 
O Fast, free pick up and tow. 
'01  Avoid the hassles of fixing and selling. 
O Help a charity you now. 

Baird Head 
Start Menu Help Wanted: First 

Baptist Church of Baird 
is presently accepting 
application for custodi-
an. Based on a 20 hour 
week. You may pick up 
an application from the 
Church Office, Monday 
thru Friday 8:00 am to 
12 Noon. 

SOS 
No Money Down 

Nationwide Homes 
Use your land or home 

Call for free appt. 
1-800-976-5341 

STARTLING new Pancho 
Villa revelations; Hardback 
book with many previously 
unpublished photographs; 
$25. Write: Villa, Box 29, 
Eastland, Texas 76448 

B52 

JONES 
REAL ESTATE 

WEEK OF DECEM- 
BER 14-18 

BREAKFAST 
MONDAY 
Scrambled Eggs 
Toast 
Orange Juice 
Milk 
TUESDAY 
Cinnamon Rolls 
Orange Slices 
Milk 
WEDNESDAY 
Post Toa sties 
Bananas 
Milk 
THURSDAY 
Pancakes 
Blueberry Topping 
Grape Juice 
Milk 
FRIDAY 
Cream of Wheat 
Toast Orange Juice 
Milk 
LUNCH 
MONDAY 
Italian Spaghetti 
Broccoli Salad 
Garlic Toast 
Pineapple Chunks 
Milk 
TUESDAY 
Tostadas w/Meat 
Refried Beans 
Peaches 
Milk 
WEDNESDAY 
Fish Sticks 
Mixed Vegetables 
Jello w/Fruit 
Bread 

Office. Building For Sate: 
Hwy frontage, CWA call tor, 
appL to see. Nationwide Homes 

No Payments Until 1998 
On Any Home During 

October. 

Girls Rocky Mountain 
Jeans denim and colors, 
Sizes 4-14, slim and regu-
lar, $24.99. Free Gift Wrap-
ping at Johnson's Dry 
Goods, Cross Plains, TX. 
254-725-6211. 

B50 

Call 1-800-ALA-LUNG STELLA WARE 
254-643-3591 1152 

,-(23:hamn AMERICAN 
LUNG 
ASSOCIATION. 

Texa s 

ROLAN JONES 
254-725-7640 

1.800-976-5341 Housekeepers need 
at Baird Motor Inn. 
Call 854-2527. 

ABANDONED 
MOBILE HOME 
MUST SELL! 

915-676-5341 

Homes B52 

BOOT REPAIR/Cothy's Corner 
201 Market St. 	Baird, Texas 

HOUSEKEEPER/COOK 
Full Time Job on Ranch 8 
Miles North of Baird call 
(9:.1) 767-3766. 

For Sale: E66 Roland key-
board with 3 1 2 IBM disk 
drive, $800.00. Also A.O. 
Smith 40 gallon electric 
water heater, dual element, 
$150.00, Rising Star, 254-
643-3912. 

For Sale by Owner: 
446 Rex St. Baird, 2 bed-
room, 1 1/2 bath, large 
corner lot, house needs 
some work. Owner fi-
nance $500 down, pay-
ments $250 per month. 
Call 673-2399. 

Miscellaneous 
B524  

GOVERNMENT 
MONEY AVAILABLE 

No Previous 
Credit Needed! 
1-800-976-5341 

.s roo 1/ 

Are you ready for the food 
service opportunity of a 
lifetime. We are looking for 
people who are eager to 
learn and earn. II you have 
ability we have the rest. 

Boot Drop Offs 
Boydston Hardware, Baird, I 

Joy's  Cleaners, Clyde 
B50 

11.52 

Remodeled, new electric, 
plumbing and gas lines, new 
windows, pecan trees, 2 lots, 
see inside to appreciate. 
$25,000 negotiable. Rising 
Star, 254-543-1100, after 5 p.m. 

B50 

Tired of Renting? 
Own Your Own Home. 

Call for Free Loan App. 

1-800-976-5341 

Johnson's Dry Goods will 
be open Sundays, noon till 
5 p.m. until Christmas. Free 
Gift Wrapping at Johnson's 
Dry Goods, Cross Plains, 
TX. 254-725-6211. 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • ••••••••• • 
Happy 80-th

•  

Birthday • 

Advertise 
In Your 
Local 

Newspaper 
854-1008 

For Rent" • Bakery Leader 
• Bakers 
• Wait Staff / All Levels 
• Line Cooks 
• Chef Trainees 
• Stewards 
• Marketing Agent 

Remember 
to send 

your 
change of 
address to 

the Cal- 
lahan 

County 
Star 

office at 
211 Market 

Street 
Baird, 
Texas 
79504.__  

651 

2 Bedroom, 1 Bath, 
Thermostatically 
Controlled Heat, Large 
Garage or Shop. 234 
East 7th. 762-2928 

1 

Flu 
Shots Jerry Loper 

Applications are now being 
accepted. Hiring will begin 
early January. Prior food 
service experience not 
required. 

C anterbury Mlle 

Of Baird 
224 E 6th Baird TX 

915-8S4-1429 
Because We Care 

Remember To 
Renew Your 
Subscription 

giong paY ,Ge/Za 

at t% lard 
Business 

ervices For applications, benefit 
information, and interview 
arPoislintinks aoritaa. S 

nulier 

Rip's Diner 
820 West Main 
P. 0. Box 856 

Eastland, Texas 76448 

Buy or Sell Avon, Great 
gifts, brochures free, call ___ 
Canda at 254-842-5112 af-
ter 3 p.m. 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • S . 

-4 	he* 	 We. 

Jilted Cane 

MEDICAL SUPPLY 
Jazz Up Your Life! 

With a Jazzy Power Chair 
Elegant non-wheelchair style 

B49 

Phone: 
254-629-3392 

Fax: 
254-629-0978 

Ta MFMFE 

1,198 

TEXAS PRESS 
Il  ASSOCIATION 

Advertise 
In Your 
Local 

Newspaper 
854-1008 

LOCALLY 
FIRST 

Shop at Home 

CALL TODAY FOR A FREE BROCHURE 
Free Delivery To Your Nome Medicare Assignment Accepted 

629-2399 or 800-6-6431 
'anterbury S Ilia 

Of Baird 
224 E 6th Baird 'R 

915-854.1429 
I- till Time: 

laint aniance 

Holiday honu6 

FREE  
CLASSIFIEDS" 

TEXAS STATEWIDE CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING NETWORK 
FREE CATALOG ..•IM.,orI 	18..8..1 	A 

a I ..0 „dor W al m A Am A 
I,  A.  - • ' vi.. 	,I .  

MIS 
IMMIMS••11. 

HEALTH AND FITNESS PRODUCTS 

Over 350 prime quality nutritional 
products to meet 
a wide range of 
personal health 
needs. An all 
natural approach 
to good health! 
Call or write to: 

MOW JIM MI Mil. 	'MEM - 	 II MI 
.••• 	 'MOM MOI 	 I 	 1 

,II -SMI 	 MI Its 	1M 	 \MI MEW 	 .SIMMI 	I 
IMIIMP, 	 NM IMI . am i 	I= Is 	 I 	INIS I 

.i.M...  VI" rif IV WAib...0 lqiiimopIraila. .lich...A.  
WOMMIIIIr Because We Care 

TexSCAN Week of 
Dec. 06, 1998 4]  WANTED 

$700 sign-on. Paid: tolls, per-
mits, cargo & liab., Worker's 
Comp., payroll taxes, holi-
days, vacation! Health Insur-
ance available. Sitton Motor 
Lines. 1-800-533-4765. 

FREE TRUCK DRIVER 
Training with no contracts or 
paybacks. No pressure, honest 
answers. Call 1-888-209-0617. 

FINANCIAL 
SERVICES 

National Co. 

FOR SALE 
AUCTIONS 

FREE INTERNET AC-
CESS! Amazing top secret 
web site shows you how! I-
900-884-1222 Ext. 7042. 
$2.99 per minute. Must be 
18yrs. Ser-U 1-619-645-8434.  

STEEL BUILDINGS -
MUST sell two steel buildings 
from cancellation! One is 
40x40, brand new, never 
erected. Will sell for balance 
owed. Call Dan 1-800-552-8504.  

STEEL BUILDINGS SALE: 
5,000+ sizes. 40x60x1.4. 
$7,821; 50x75x14, $10,324; • 
50x100x I 6, 	$13,663; 
60x100x16, $15,236. Mini-
storage buildings, 40x180, 36 
units, 	$17,818.Free 
brochures. Sentinel Buildings, 
1-800-327-0790, ext 79. 
www.sentinclbuildings.com. 

WATER CONDITIONING -
SALT Free, maintenance free 
systems under $1,000. Life-
time warranty. Easy, do it 
yourself installation. 90 day 
unconditional guarantee. Inde-
pendent GMX International 
Distributor. Louis 877-795-6895.  

WOLFF TANNING BDS. 
Tan at home. Buy direct and 
save! Commercial/Horne units 
from $199.00. Low monthly 
payments. Free color catalog. 
Call today, 1-800-842-1310.  

PETS/ LIVESTOCK  
FOR PENNIES MORE, get 
latest technology in liquid 
wormers. HAPPY JACK 
LIQUI-VICT delivers actives 
better than older formulas. 
Fccd and Hardware Stores. 
www.happyjackinc.com. 

Back To Eden 
604 W 10th St- Cisco, TX 76437 

(264) 442-3197 

• To run one time 
• One ad per family 
• 25 Words or Less 

SEIZURES, BANK REPOS 
& secured creditors. Public 
Auto Auction, December 1 2th 
at Traders Village. Loop 290 
& Eldridge. Starts @ 11:00 
a.m. Call 1-800-698-4623. 

BUSINESS 
OPPORTUNITIES  

AVON PRODUCTS - START 
your own business. Work flex-
ible hours. Enjoy unlimited 
earnings. Call toll free 1-888-
942-4053. $20 start-up- 

LOCAL CANDY ROUTE. 
30 vending machines. Earn 
approximately $800/day. All 
for $9,995. Call 1-800-998-
VEND. Multi-Vend, Inc. 

WOULD LIKE TO LOCATE A 
COUSIN... who lives in Abilene. 
She is the daughter of Cline 
and Eula Taylor of Loraine, 
Texas. Her given name Is 
Shirley. Please write Berna 
McCracken Chick, Box 21, 
Rising Star, Tx 76471 or call 
254-643-4954. 

DRIVERS: COMPANY 
DRIVERS - Regional fleet, 
home most weekends. 
Longhaul also. Mostly Mid-
west/Southeast. New Truck 
Purchase Plan Available. Call 
1-800-888-0203.  

DRIVERS - START UP To 
34c/mile! "2,500-3,000 miles/ 
week. *100% conventional 
sleepers. 'Benefits & Bonus 
program. 'Mostly no touch/ 
Drop & Hook. Call OTRX today! 
1-800-423-6939.  

"NEW PAY Package" 
Teams earn up to 44c/mile. 
Solos earn up to 32c/mile. Pay 
package includes safety & lon-
gevity bonuses. 3 months + 
school minimum experience. 
80 % Drop & hook, no touch 
freight, assigned conventional 
freightliners, incredible ben-
efits & miles, miles, miles. 
Call now to secure a spot for 
our Laredo, Tx. Orientation on 
December 14th. Celadon 
Trucking, 1-800-729-9770.  

RAPID FREIGHT OF Texas 
is seeking OTR drivers. Mini-
mum 1 year experience. Class 
A CDL with HazMat required. 
Call recruiting 1-800-299-
7274, ext. 21 or ext. 41.  

EDUCATIONAL/ 
TRAINING 

A DEBT-FREE LIFE! Con-
fidential help. Cut monthly 
payments. Reduce interest. 
Stop collection calls. Avoid 
bankruptcy. Nation's largest 
nonprofit: Genus Credit Manage-
ment. 24 hrs, 1-800-317-9971.  

ARE YOU DROWNING IN 
Debt? Debt relief: free, imme-
diate, confidential. Consoli-
date payments, lower interest. 
Call 1-888-BILL-FREE or 1-
888-245-5373. American 
Credit Counselors, Non-
profit.  

*AVOID BANKRUPTCY?* 
Debt consolidation. Stop col-
lection calls. Cut monthly 
payments to 50%. Eliminate 
finance charges. Fast approval. 
National Consolidators. 1-800-
270-9894. 

DON'T BE 
CRUSHED BY THE 

COMPETITION 

\, 

Offer Ends December 15, 1998 

Write and bring in ads 
No call-ins please 

B51 R. 

For Sale 
Holiday Bonus Ads 

will run in these newspapers: 
Callahan County Star, Cisco Press, 

Eastland Telegram, 
Ranger Times, Rising Star , 

DRIVERS WANTED  
CONTINENTAL EXPREa$ 
NEEDS OTR & Regional 
drivers. Voted among the top 
10 small carriers, Paid ben-
efits. 90.95% no-touch freight. 
1-800-727-4374. EOE. 1-800-
695-4473. 

DRIVER - C/O-0/0. Super 
Regional! What is it? We've 
got it! You'll want it! Call for 
information. Class A CDL re-
quircu. Arnold Transportaiton, 
1-800.454-2887. 

BABY BUTTON ANGELS--
Just In time for Christmas. 
For Christmas ornaments and 
decoration. All varieties. $8 
each. Call 254-643-4954. 

851 
SCASH FOR MO RT. 
GAGES$ If you are receiving 
payments on a mortgage, we 
can convert them to immedi-
ate cash. Twenty years expe-
rience. Highest prices. 1-800-
676-3500 Covenant Financial.  

!!GET OUT OF Debt Free!! 
Credit Counseling Centers of 
America (Member NFCC). 
Free debt consolidation, lower 
payments, interest. Stop col-
lector calls. Non-profit, 
1-877-936-2222. Toll free.  

NEED CASH? IMMEDI-
ATE Cash paid for future 
settlement payments, lottery 
winnings, and insurance. Call 
SingerAsset 1-800-605-5007 
www.singerasset.com.  

OVER YOUR HEAD in 
debt? Credit cards/ bills? *Cut 
payments up to 60%!!! 
*Maintain good credit. *Free 
consultation 1-800-556-1548. 
www.anewhorizon.org. Li-
censed, bonded, non-profit, 

ADVERTISE!  
4" le .elide ..ecje ..&je .Zede 4cie .ecie .dcje 

CALLAHAN COUNTY STAR 
Publication No. (USPS 085-520) 

41998 Eastland County Newspapers, Inc. 
(915) 854-1008 211 Market St. Baird, Tx 79504 

Periodical Postage paid at Baird, Texas; 
under Act of Congress in March, 1870. 

Published every Thursday. 

DRIVER: COVENANT 
TRANSPORT 'Coast to 
Coast Runs' Teams start 35c-
37c. $1,000 sign-on bonus for 
experienced company drivers. 
For experienced drivers and 
owner operators, I.800-441-
4394. Graduate students 
1-800-338-6428. 

BECOME A MEDICAL tran-
scriptionist. Opportunity to 
work at home or in office typ-
ing for doctors. Home study. 
Free literature. P.C.D.I., At-
lanta. Georgia. 1-800-362-
7070. Dept. YYP722. 

COMPANY SPONSORED 
TRAINING & First year in-
come $30K - Stevens Trans-
port - (VTR truck drivers 
wanted! Non-experienced or 
experienced, 1-8010-333-8595. 

ti  
DRIVER - FLATBED. 
START up to .34c/mile. Medi-
cal, Dental & Life, 401(K). 
Consistent miles. Midwest or 
48 states. 3 years OTR + I year 
flatbed. Combined Transport. 
1-800-637-4407.  

DRIVER/OTR - A NEW ap-
proach to OW/OP Program! 

REAL ESTATE Publisher 	 H. V. & Gaynell O'Brien 
Editor 	 Carol Smith HIGH DESERT MOUN-

TAIN Country - South of Van 
Horn. 320 acres, mule deer, 
quail. javelin, dove, $2,000 
down, $273/month. Texas Vet. 
1-830.257-5629. 

POSTMASTER: Send address changes to Callahan 
County Star, 211 Market St., Baird, Texas 79504. 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
$15 per year in Callahan County; $16 per year tor Counties 

Adjoining Callahan; $18 per year in Texas, out of Callahan 
County; $21 per year out of Texas. 

`t. 
NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee their products or services advertised. We urge our readers to use 
s'auli.)11 and when in doubt, contact your local Better Business  Bureau for information about the company before sending money. 

Call this Newspaper to 40.111150 Statewide or Regionally, or Call 512-477-6755. ‘71 
Ieje ..ege 	e .44 	e .g'e'e Zie ..dez(e' 
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11111D WITH MI AND SUSPENSE" 
"A 110111-Y01111-

BREATH Hly" 

THE SIEGE 
WITH 

DENZEL WASHINGTON ANNETTE BENING 
AND BRUCE WILLIS 

1-800-588-3339 
	

254-647-3207 
Ranger, Texas 

Specializing in cracked slabs, pier and 
beams. Work done by contract only. 

Up to 5 year written guarantee. 
Senior Citizen Discounts 

NO JOB <TOO SMALL WILL TRAVEL 
20 Years Experience 	6.104 
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FIND THESE WORDS IN THE PUZZLE BELOW. 

 

  

ART 
	

LITERATURE READING 
ENGLISH 
	

MATH 
	

SCIENCE 
GEOGRAPHY P.E. 	 SPELLING 
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THE WORDS READ UP. DOWN AND ACROSS. 
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J & J Air Conditioning, Inc. 
201 South Lamar Eastland 

254-629-2251 TAW30023001 800-585-2251 

current economic 
conditions in agri-
culture. 

Delegates also said 
more emphasis should 
be placed on Risk 
Management in the 
Fair Act. Specifically, 
they said more 
affordable crop insur-
ance programs should 
be developed. The 
current program 
should be revised, they 
added. They said it 
should contain ade-
quate program fund-
ing, broader coverage 
at reasonable rates, 
price and yield pro-
tection, coverage for 
alternative crops, 
ability to insure for 
input cost, prevented 
planting provision, 
and other specifics. 

Also on the national 
level, delegates voted 

to: 
Enhance export com-

petitiveness by utiliz-
ing various export 
subsidies so that inter-
national economic con-
ditions have less 
impact on domestic 
prices. 

Recommend that the 
agricultural census be 
voluntary. 

Oppose Environ-
mental Protection 
Agency implementa-
tion of the Food Quality 
Protection Act unless 
actions are based on 
scientific facts. 

On the state le' al, 
delegates voted to: 

Support local Soil 
and Water Conserva-
tion Districts' ability to 
provide technical as-
sistance and incent-
ives for voluntary soil 
and water conservation 

THEATR  E 

I N 
STEREO SURROUND 

Fri. • Sat. • Sun. • Mon. 
All Shows: 7:30 p.m. - $3.50 

10-Admission Passes - $30.00 
5-Admission Gift Pass - $17.50 

Adults Only Balcony Ticket - $5.00 

4§tanteix, 
Responsible grandfather, 

father and son seeking family 
deer lease for year-round use. 

Prefer house on property. 
Multi-year option a plus. 

References available. 
Call 817-498-0250 

4 
or 817-276-7755. 

eer Lease 
6.106 

Home Health Services 
Penny Sparks, Branch Manager 

ENTRAL BAIL' BONDS 
Kenneth Knowles, OWNER 	 _ 	• 

Letha Evans, Agent 
200 1/2 N. Mulberry 	Eastland, TX 76448 

Across The Street From Jail 

629-3804 
24 Hr 
Credit 
Bonds 

Se 
Habla 

Espanol 
• lc, 

It's Nobody's Busines 
By George Young Hammond 

It's nobody's business what I drink; 
I care not what my neighbors think 
Or how many laws they choose to pass. 
I'll tell the world I'll have my glass! 
Here's one man's freedom cannot be cured; 
My right to drink is undisturbed." 
So he drank in spite of law or man, 
Then got into his old tin can. 
Stepped on the gas and let it go 
Down the highway to and fro. 
He took the curves at forty mile 
With bleary eyes and a drunken smile. 
Not long till a car he tried to pass; 
Then a crash, a scream and breaking glass, 
The other car is upside down about two miles 
from the nearest town. 
The man is clear but his wife is caught, 
And he needs the help of that drunken sot 
Who sits in a mauldin drunken daze, 
And hears the screams and sees the blaze, 
But too far gone to save a life 
By helping the car from off the wife 
The car is burned and a mother dies, 
While a husband weeps and a baby cries 
And a drunk sits by, and still some think 
t's nobody's business what they drink. 

A. J. Thomas 

Thursday, December 10,1998 
There are three age 

divisions, including 8-
9 years old, 10-11, and 
12-13; one each for boys 
and girls. Age divi-
sions are determined 
by the contestants age 
as of April 1, 1999. Each 
participant will have 25 
opportunities to shoot 
free throws, and the 
boys and girls in each 
division with the most 
successful of 25 shots 
advance to the North 
Central District con-
test. 

The winners from 
the local contest will 
advance to the district 
contest, which will be 
held here in Brecken-
ridge at L.T. Cook 
Gymnasium 	on 
January 23, 1999. Last 
year Lindsey Short, 
from Breckenrige, 
Texas, won the 8-9 year 
old division at the local 
and district contest. 
After the district contest 
she advanced to state 
competition, where she 
placed second. 

Cisco Press - Eastland Telegram - Ranger Times - Rising Sr 

Texas Farm Bureau 
Delegates Approve 
Program At Convention 

As the Texas Farm vention, Donald Pat-
Bureau State Con-  man of Waxahachie 
vention concluded in was reelected as Vice 
Lubbock Dec. 2, the President of the 
voting 	delegates organization. Delmas 
approved a program to McCormick of Floyd-
take the state's largest ada was reelected as 
farm organization into 	secretary-treasurer. 
the new millennium. 

"Called Project 2000, 
the delegates approved 
and funded a program 
that will carry Texas 
Farm Bureau into the 
next century," said Bob 
Stallman, who was 
reelected to his sixth 
consecutive term as the 
organization's Presi-
dent. 

"The program will 
allow Farm Bureau to 
better serve agriculture 
and achieve our goals." 

Specifically, 	th e 
program addresses the 
following initiatives: 

Increased admini-
strative assistance for 
county leaders. 

Increased emphasis 
on agriculture in the 
classroom activities. 

Increased public 
relation activities. 

Increased market-
ing and risk manage-
ment educational op-
portunities. 

Establishes a legal 
defense fund to fight for 
agricultural interests. 

Project 2000 will be 
funded by a $5 
membership dues in-
crease. 

"This program will 
help farmers and 
ranchers tell the story 
of the vitally important 
role agriculture plays 
in the lives of their 
urban neighbors," 
Stallman 	said. 
"Agriculture and our 
organization will be 
stronger because of it." 

Following the con- 

Do you or someone you know 
need home health care? 

Lifeline Home Health can provide you or your 
loved one with care you need to help you regain 
your independence. Any concerns or questions 

please call us, we wil be glad to help. 

119 W. Main Ranger, Texas 
254-647-1137 	800-547-1137 	FAX 254-647-1520 

Elks Hoop Shoot 
Competition In '99 

Saturday, January 9, 
1999, marks the first 
round of competition in 
the 27th annual "Elks 
Hoop Shoot" to be held 
in L.T. Cook Gymna- 

planning and imple-
mentation. 

Favor a state funded 
program to eradicate 
the boll weevil. 

Oppose national 
standards for pollution 
control. Rather, they 
said pollution control 
standards should be 
developed at the state 
and local level. 

Recommend that 
Texas grown beef, lamb 
and goat meat be 
incorporated into the 
menus of Texas public 
schools and prisons. 

Support the $1.50 per 
$100 cap on the tax rate 
for maintenance and 
operation of schools. 

Complete System 
Must order by 12-17-98 

254-629-2618 
Arther Business Products 
1 Year Parts and Labor Warranty 

"On Site" 3 Year Warranty on 
Hard Drive and Monitor. 
Year 2000 Complaint! 
Installation Included! 

Internet Ready! 
Financing Available! 

Payments as Low as 

$45.00 per month/36 Months 

1 Page Credit Application 
Trust 20 Years Experience 

in Eastland County 

937 E. Main St. Eastland 
Located with JC Penney ABP 

6-104 

Horat5, 86CC6014, 33CLR1 101,1A, 

if & jae,R,Do 6o 

rilte Asia 
(Kestaurant 

1-20 Exit 343 • Eastland, TX • EZ On EZ Off 

Dine in or carry out 
Drive thru window 
Buffet Service 11-9 

Group Party Specials 
Call in advance 

629-3301 
Ink41 	<1,1 .4,f 

••••••••••••••••••••••••••• • • • • 
• • •• 
• ga/4r,e.  51`ea'o 	• • • 
• • • • 
• Open House Deghstration • • 
• December 18 7 - 9 p.m. 
• 
• Come see the studio and enroll in classes in 	• 

O 
• 
• 
• 
• 

• - 	 Co---ity Star 
Meanwhile, the farm 

bill and related items 
dealing with farm 
policy took center stage 
the last day of the 
convention. Delegates 
said they supported the 
concepts contained 
under the Federal 
Agricultural Improve-
ment and Reform Act 
of 1996 (FAIR Act) but 
said the act should be 
reexamined because of 

sium in Breckenridge. 

Hoop Shoot is the copy-
right trademark owned 
by the Elks for this na-
tional free throw shoot-
ing contest. It was orig-
inated by Frank Hise, 
a Past Grand Exalted 
Ruler of the fraternal 
organization, in Cor-
vallis, Ore. in 1946. 
The Elks' Oregon State 
Association directed 
the program on a na-
tional level beginning 
in 1972. Three million 
youngsters, ages 8 
through 13 participated 
last year. 

Registration will be 
held in the gymnasium 
from 8 a.m. until 9:45 
a.m., and the competi-
tion will begin at 10 
a.m. Participants must 
register during the pre-
scribed registration pe-
riod. There is no fee to 
enter the contest. 

$1395.00 	
Chrietma6 Sale 

AMD K6-2/300 MHz System, 32 MB 
100Hz SDRAM, 4.3GB Western Digital 
Ultra HDD "#1 Rated Hard drive in In-
dustry", 4 Meg AGP Video, 32X CD, Wave 
Sound & Speakers, 56K VDF Modem, MS 
Mouse, 15" .28 NLSVGA Monitor, Win-
dows 98, Microsoft Home Bundle Soft-
ware includes MS Works, Money, Games, 
Encarta Encylopedia, Lexmark 3200 
Color Ink Jet Printer "Rated Best In It's 
Class," Power Protection, Printer Cable. 

Zat 

Ballet, Tap, Jazz, Gymnastics 	••• 
and Cheerleading 	• 

• 
• 

--- • 
254-647-3333 	 • 

Classes begin January 4 	 •
reeeeeeseoeeeoeeeeeo• 

513 Hwy. 80 West Ranger 
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Callahan County Star 
Scenes From Cowboy Christmas Parade 

Thursday, December 10,1998 

Baird Athletes join the 
Cowboy Christmas Parade 
on their athletic float. 

Lyman Brigham brings Santa into Baird during 
the Cowboy Christmas Parade Saturday. 

Calabar! County *tar 
For Special 

Holiday Advertising Rates 

915-854-1008 
Let us help you pass the savings on to your customers 

Remember To Renew 
Your Subscription 

Advertise 
In Your 
Local 

Newspaper 

S5-I-11111$ '  

Mr. Riney, Baird Elementary Principal, plays the Calliope 
during the Cowboy Christmas Parade as Kelby Robinson and 
T.J. Hunter give him a ride through town. 

LOCALLY 
FIRST 

Shop at Home 

Remember Te 
Renew Your 
Subscription!! 

Renew Your 
Subscription 

Aut 

LOCALLY 
FIRST 

Shop at Home 

it• 

Merry Christmas am!ilappyltaliclaust 

-Vint glatiorul Rzni Raird would /de to welcome 

everyone to their Open. ilertae. 

• 6badadt, 'Wanton 18, /998 
* 1:00 p.m.- 6:00 e... 

4.4‘,.;ta Sewed 

Please allow ea lo tacitness appitediation k ra, S mimed «atoms.. 

First National Bank. Baird 

Queer 113 Yeard onteonai Sendai 

Letter To The Editor Need to have a Garage Sale? 
Need to sell that old car? 

Need to sell a house? 

Take advantage 
of our 

SLOCr 
Classifieds 

*Ads are $1.00 per issue, up to 25 words, 
extra words 5e per word, per issue 

Cattaban County Sat 
211 Market St. Baird 

915-854-1008 

BUY 1 
NEW LOCAL 

SUBSCRIPTION 
GET 1 

GIFT SUBSCRIPTION 
FREED 

EXTRA!!! 'Peal Nano EXTRA!!! 
Renew Your 

Callahan County Star 
For 6 Mos. And Get 6 Mos. 

FREE! FREE ! FREE! FREE!  

Subscribe now and take 
advr...!age of this fantastic offer. 

Dear Editor: 
I want to thank the 

People of Texas for the 
great honor and Privi-
lege of serving in the 
Texas Legislature, as 
Railroad 
Commissioner, and 
finally as Comptroller 
of Public Accounts. 
Ours is a unique and 
mighty state that is spe-
cial in every sense of 
the word. 

These of us who have 
had the privilege of 
runnin 

	

	 se g for and m- 
. ing in statewide office 
have a special appreci-
ation for the diversity, j 
ben ty and majesty of  

the Lone Star State. 
You have given m 

the opportunity to mak 
a positive difference i 
this state and I will al 
ways be thankful fo 
that Although my race 
for 	Lieutenant 
Governor was not suc 
cessful, it does not di-
minish the thankful- 

end appreciation I 
have for the people of 
our great state. 

On behalf of my 
family and myself, I 
thank you all for the op-
portunity you gave me 
to serve Ibxas. 

John Sharp 
Comptroller of 

Public Accounts 
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