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Valley Patriots Enter 

Bi-District Playoff 

School Board Election 

To Be Held Soon 
The Valley Patriots enter the 

Bi-District playoff Thursday 
evening (today) at 8:00 o'clock at 
Hutcherson Center on the cam-
pus of Wayland Baptist Univer-
sity in Plainview. Their first 
game may be the winning game 
of the tournament. They play 
Happy, a strong team. The 
Valley Patriots have won 24 
games and lost two over the 
season, and Happy has a record 
of 17-6. The Valley Patriots split 
two practice games, conceding to 
McGargle 77-83 last Friday 
night, and taking a win over 
Stratford Tuesday night at Pan-
handle. 

In Friday night's game, Valley 
lagged 18-20 at the end of the 
first period, 32-47 at halftime, 
52-59 at the third stop, and 77-83 
at the final buzzer. 

Tommy Williams took indivi-
dual scoring honors with 23 

The basketball season for the 
Lady Patriots came to an abrupt 
halt Thursday in their Bi-District 
playoff game with Sudan. Sudan 
extended their record to 28-3, 
while the Lady Patriots finish at 
20-6. The game was played at 

MRS. VIOLA BOYLES 

CELEBRATES BIRTHDAY 

Mrs. Beverly (Rogers) Howard 
of Amarillo sent a subscription 
renewal to the Valley Tribune for 
her grandmother, Mrs. Viola 
Boyles of New Boston, Texas. 
Mrs. Howard sends the newspa-
per to her grandmother each 
year. 

The editor thought the area 
would be interested in the 
following item. 

Mrs. Boyles, a former Quita-
que resident, celebrated her 
eightieth birthday anniversary 
on the previous Saturday (the 
letter was dated February 14). 
Her brother's wife prepared a 
birthday dinner for her on 
Sunday and her grandchildren 
and great-grandchildren sent 
cards and gifts. Mrs. Howard 
states, "She's such a wonderful 
grandma. It seems impossible for 
her to be 80 years young." 

The editor thought her friends 
in Quitaque might like to send 
her a card shower, even though 
her birthday is passed. Her 
address is Viola Boyles, 115 Link 
Homes, New Boston, Texas 
75570. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ewayne Barbee 
and family of Clarendon spent 
Monday with his grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Barbee, in 
Quitaque.  

points in this game, closely 
followed by Brett Cheatham with 
20 points. Randy Fuston dropped 
in 13; McNary, 10; Will Williams. 
six, and Kraig Cox, five. 

The Tuesday night game start-
ed off even with both teams at 14 
at the first bell. The Patriots 
gained six points and led 31-25 at 
halftime. Stratford gained on the 
Patriots in the third quarter and 
the score stood at 4137 at the 
end of three periods of play. The 
final score was 63-58 with the 
Patriots on top. 

Scoringwise, Jerry McNary, 
Kraig Cox and Randy Fuston 
dropped in 14 points each. 

The Valley fans are urged to 
go to Plainview to support the 
Patriots Thursday night. It 
might make the difference in 
winning or losing as to how much 
support the boys have from 
home. 

Plainview. 
The Sudan girls got off to a 

good start, leading 18-7 at the 
first bell, then 31-11 at halftime. 
At the end of three quarters, the 
Sudan lead was 50-20, and the 
final score was 66-32. 

Candy Jones scored 18 of 
Valley's 32 points. 

Coach Tommy Waldrop states: 
"We had a good season with 
nothing to be ashamed of, being 
beaten by one of the better 
teams in the state." He says it is 
going to be hard to replace three 
seniors, Candy Jones, Angie Clay 
and Elaine Adams. These girls 
averaged 20 rebounds and 35 
points between them each game. 
They will be hard to replace. He 
says he is looking forward to 
starting over next year. 

Congratulations for a good 
season, girls! 

Lottie Owens drove to Silver-
ton Sunday morning early and 
took her sister, Mrs. 011ie 
McMinn, to Canyon where they 
were guests of the Melvin 
Watkins family for lunch. Mrs. 
Watkins had prepared a birthday 
dinner for her mother, Mrs. 
McMinn, who celebrated her 
birthday Wednesday, February 
23. Mrs. McMinn is 76 years 
young and shoveled snow for five 
hours during the last snow storm 
(not by choice). 

Others present were Mr. and 
Mrs. Ewing Vaughan of Silver-
ton; Mr. and Mrs. Travis McMinn 
of Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. Ben 
Shoemake and sons, Todd and 
Matt, and Anita Watkins, Amar-
illo. Melanie Watkins was spend-
ing the weekend with friends in 
Amarillo but she came home for 
an hour to visit her grandmother. 

MARY L. McCRACKEN 

LUCKY LADY SHOWS OFF 

INAUGURAL INVITATION 

Mary L. McCracken, aunt of 
Mary Polk, successful candidate 
for representative from the 73rd 
District in El Paso, is holding her 
engraved invitation to the inaug-
uration held in Austin January 
18. 

It read: "The Inaugural Com-
mittee requests the honor of 
your presence to attend and 
participate in the Inauguration of 
Mark Wells White as Governor 
of the State of Texas and William 
P. Hobby as Lieutenant Gover-
nor of the State of Texas on 
Tuesday the 18th of January 
1983 in the City of Austin," with 
the impressive seal of the State 
of Texas at the top. 

Mrs. McCracken's parents re-
ceived an invitation to the 
inauguration in 1912 when Gov-
ernor Colquitt was inaugurated. 
Since Mary was born within a 
few short months of that time, 
she would have been named for 
the governor if she had been a 
boy. It was not until her brother 
was born a few years later that 
they were able to make use of the 
name "Colquitt." 

The Tribune received a call 
from Mrs. J. A. McKay of 
Hereford last week and she 
reports she spent several days in 
the hospital in December. She 
states she is still not feeling well. 
She sends regards to area 
friends. 

Bill Mayfield and daughter, 
Jill, of Panhandle spent Friday 
night and Saturday visiting Bill's 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. A. 
Mayfield, in Quitaque. Mrs. Bill 
Mayfield had flown to Austin to 
attend a Teachers Meeting. 

The Board of Trustees of the 
Turkey-Quitaque ISD have cal-
led an election to be held on April 
2, 1983 to fill two positions. The 
positions will fill the expiring 
terms of Jarrell Rice and Murry 
Wayne Morrison and will be 

With The Sick 

Mrs. Rex (Elaine) Harmon was 
taken to Hall County Hospital in 
Memphis Thursday of last week. 
She returned home Sunday. 

Mrs. Harmon was returned to 
Hall County Hospital Tuesday 
morning. She has not gained 
strength and the doctor re-admit-
ted her to the hospital. 

Mrs. Eulalia Coker returned to 
her home Tuesday after having 
spent several days in Hall 
County Memorial Hospital in 
Memphis. 

• 
Dr. Wayne D. Maxwell was 

transferred from Hall County 
Hospital to the Southwest Osteo-
pathic Hospital in Amarillo Sat-
urday night. He is reported to be 
doing satisfactorily. 

Mrs. George Johnson had 
surgery at Methodist Hospital in 
Lubbock Monday of this week. 
She is reported to be in satisfac-
tory condition. 

• 
Mrs. David Aubuchon return-

ed to her home in Turkey 
Tuesday morning from Hall 
County Hospital in Memphis. She 
entered the hospital Sunday 
night. 

MEN'S INVITATIONAL 

ROUND ROBIN VOLLEYBALL 

TOURNAMENT PLANNED 

The Valley Athletic Depart-
ment will sponsor a men's 
invitational round robin volley. 
ball tournament Saturday, Feb-
ruary 26, beginning at 8:00 a.m. 
and continuing all day. 

Teams from Amarillo, Lub-
bock and Plainview, including 
some of the former State Cham-
pion Volleyball Teams, have been 
invited. 

Only one local team will play. 
It is made up of Joey Barefield, 
Jim Saul and Rod Carpenter, all 
of Quitaque, Danny Perkins and 
Bobby McPherson of Silverton, 
and James Stephens of Matador. 

A concession stand serving 
hamburgers and the trimmings 
will be open all day. Coach Ted 
Giddens will be in charge of it. 

Everyone is urged to come out 
and support this effort.  

elected for three years. 
Mrs. Josephine Cagle and Mrs. 

Willie Grace Majors were named 
as absentee balloting clerks. 
Absentee voting will begin 
March 14, 1983 and end on March 
29 and will be conducted at 
Valley School. 

Anyone wishing to file for a 
position on the school board must 
file no later than March 2. 
Applications are available at the 
school business office. 

Voting will take place at 
Turkey and Quitaque along with 
city elections. 

GENE FUSTONS RETURN 

FROM TRIP TO OLD MEXICO 

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Fuston 
returned Sunday from a ten-day 
trip to Matzalan, Sinola, Mexico. 
Gene won the trip in an area 
Allsup's contest. They went by 
private plane from Clovis, New 
Mexico with three other couples 
who had won contests from 
Allsup's and the Borden Com-
pany. 

A highlight of the trip, they 
reported, was going deep-sea 
fishing and Gene catching an 8 ft. 
2 in. sailfish. 

QUITAQUE SENIOR 

CITIZENS TO MEET 

NEXT THURSDAY NIGHT 

The Quitaque Senior Citizens 
meet Thursday, March 3, in 
regular session. The main item 
on the agenda will be the 
adoption of the by-laws. 

All interested citizens 55 years 
of age and older are urged to be 
present. 

Mrs. Estelle Davidson drove to 
Olton Thursday and spent the 
night with her granddaughter 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Edwards and children. She spent 
Friday night with her brother 
and wife, Mr. and Mrs. H. R. 
Curtis. Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
returned home with her Satur-
day and they all drove to 
Memphis and spent the night and 
Sunday visiting a sister and 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. Elam 
Orcutt. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charley Grundy 
drove to Lubbock and visited her 
sister, Mrs. Fannie Mae Lokey 
and she accompanied them on to 
Lamesa where they visited an-
other sister. Mrs. Inez McBray-
er, and she accompanied them on 
to Brackettville. They were 
joined there by another sister 
and husband, Mr. and Mrs. Runt 
Vardell of Tulle. They spent from 
Thursday until Sunday, ten days. 
They report a good time but not 
much luck fishing. 

Lady Patriots Playoff Bid Falls Short 
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Turkey Lions Club held a 
banquet Thursday night, Febru-
ary 17, at the Bob Wills Cafeteria 
in celebration of the annual 
Ladies Night. It was catered by 
Turkey Drive Inn. 

Charter members and widows 
of charter members were invit-
ed, but several were unable to 
attend. 

Master of ceremonies was Boss 
Lion Roy Patterson, who told the 
group that the club was organiz-
ed in 1928 with the late Dr. M. T. 
Blume as its first president. The 
information was taken from a 
history compiled by George 

The Valley Tribune received a 
letter and news release from the 
Plainview Cultural Affairs Coun-
cil asking for coverage on the 
planned activities for Plainview 
for the month of March. 

Plainview is lucky to have 
a scheduled display by the 
Colorado State University's In-
ternational Poster Exhibition, on 
its tour of the country. This 
group made an extended appear-
ance at the World's Fair in 
Nashville last summer. The 
reason Plainview was so lucky to 
get the group was due to the 
connection of Dr. Jim Nelson of 
Ring-A-Round Products with 
Colorado State. Dr. Nelson has 
recently moved to Plainview. 

The Cultural Affairs Council is 
planning to use a vacant school 
building to display the 208 pieces 
of graphic arts. It will cover 
advertising art and political art 
and message art. 

In the eyes of those with 
historic interests, this should be 
the beginning of a return to 
Plainview's youthful days in the 
early days of West Texas when 
the farm community was known 
as the Athens of the Plains. 

The Council has enrolled the 
civic theatre for a presentation of 
a Plainview-written, award win-
ning one-act play, "Wings of the 
Morning," which was first produ-
ced by the Lubbock Theatre 
Centre in 1975. It has taken an 
award in the Festival of Ameri-
can Community Theatres Compe-
tition and a first place award 

Setliff. Irl Twills and Paul 
Meacham were charter members 
present. Other special guests 
were Mrs. Paul Meacham and 
Mrs. Willis Walker. 

The cafeteria was beautifully 
decorated with pastel balloons, 
crepe paper and assorted flow-
ers. Mrs. Meacham won the 
centerpiece. 

Entertainment was by Pat 
Seigler, Ann Seigler, Jimmy 
Taylor and Ken Trent, all of 
Paducah, who gave a program of 
vocal and instrumental music 
that was greatly enjoyed by all 
those present. 

over 85 entries in the Virginia 
Wiesbrod National Playwriting 
Competition. It will be produced 
on March 4-5 and March 11-12 in 
Plainview under the direction of 
its author, Juanice Myers. 

Other items of interest in the 
month of March will be the 
internationally reknown Her-
rington String Quartet from 
Amarillo which will give a 
performance on March 10. It is 
nationally recognized as one of 
only six such groups in this 
country invited to participate in 
the Julliard String Quartet 
Workshop and Symposium. 

The Texas Heritage Founda-
tion's Texas Ranger Exhibit is 
scheduled for the school for a 
month-long visit. 

The Plainview Symphony, a 
young, growing group of fame, is 
scheduled to produce a number 
of ensemble performances. 

A week-long college-university 
art exhibit is scheduled for 
March 7-12, and an equally long 
exhibition of Public School art for 
March 21-26. 

Those of the area who are 
interested in art and culture and 
history are asked to mark this 
schedule on your calendar and 
plan to participate in all or part 
of the activities. 

"It is generally better to 
deal by speech than by 
letter." 	Francis Bacon 
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Turkey Lions Club Has 

Ladies Night Banquet 

Plainview Broadening Cultural Affairs 

HEADS & HEELS 
KATY ROBISON, OWNER 
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Smith-Reed Vows 

Exchanged In Ceremony 

COLLEEN and WAYNE REED 

PHONE 455-14-41 QUITAQUE 	 MEMRI:It DIC 

Will Forms Are Available Free Of Charge At The 

FIRST NATIONAL BANK 

p:r 0 A/44  

One Of Your 

MOST IMPORTANT STEPS 

COULD BE AN 

UP - TO - DATE WILL 

a 2 

••• 

Between brass candelabra in-
tertwined with bronze and yel-
low mums and brown ribbons. 
Colleen Smith and Wayne Reed 
exchanged wedding vows at 
three o'clock in the afternoon on 
Sunday. January 2, at the First 
United Methodist Church in 
Paducah. Reverend Henry Sal-
ley, pastor, performed the single-
ring ceremony in front of the 
altar which held the couple's 
memory candle and brass candle- 

sticks. The couple lighted their 
memory candle during the play-
ing of "You and I." 

Addle and Wayde Smith of 
Paducah are parents of the bride. 
The groom is the son of Faye 
Stockton of Turkey and George 
Reed of Silverton. 

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a candle-
light satin gown featuring a 
Queen Anne neckline, bishop 
sleeves gathered into wide cuffs 

by Alencon lace appliques and 
crystal pleating. Her fingertip 
veil with lace appliques and 
Schiffli embroidery edging fell 
from a satin and lace Juliet cap. 
She carried a colonial bouquet 
featuring yellow roses with yel-
low and bronze mums and a 
cascade of brown, rust and ivory 
ribbons. 

Bridal tradition was carried 
out with pennies in her shoe 
minted in the birth years of the 
bride and groom, for something 
old; her wedding ensemble, for 
something new; a pearl necklace 
borrowed from her sister, and a 
blue garter. 

Guests were registered by 
Sharma Smith of Hereford, sister 
of the bride. Prenuptial piano 
music was by Judy Smith of 
Canyon, the bride's other sister. 
Traditional organ selections 
were played by Betty Atkinson 
of Childress. 

The reception in the fellowship 
hall, hosted by the bride's 
parents, consisted of a dinner of 
brisket. ham, baked beans, gour-
met potatoes, tossed salad, layer-
ed strawberry salad, rolls and 
iced tea. The tables were covered 
with gold cloths centered with 
brown, rust and gold satin 
streamers accented with bou-
quets of bronze and yellow 
MUMS. 

The bride's table was covered 
with an ecru lace cloth over gold. 
The candlelight cake featured a 
raised heart-shaped tier decorat-
ed with brown, yellow and rust 
flowers. A brass candlestick 
accented with mums and ribbon 
and the bride's bouquet complet-
ed the table decor. 

The meal was prepared and 
served by Gail Long of Paducah, 
cousin of the bride, and Jane 
Huey of Guthrie. Also assisting 
were Betty Daniel of Amarillo, 
Nada Smith and Ann Nell Smith 
of Dumont, aunts of the bride. At 
the end of the meal, Judy and 
Sharma Smith served the wed- 

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Ramsey of 
Quitaque drove to Waco over the 
weekend to attend the Commis-
sioning Service at Waco Hall at 
Baylor University. Their daugh-
ter, Dana Ramsey, is scheduled 
to go to Mexico as a summer 
missionary with a group of BSU 
from Wayland Baptist Univer-
sity. 

The Ramseys report it was a 
very impressive service. 

ding cake. 
Following their wedding trip 

to San Antonio, the couple is at 
home in Lubbock. The bride is a 
1982 graduate of Texas Tech 
University with a business de-
gree and is employed by United 
Parcel Service. The groom is a 
candidate for May graduation 
from Texas Tech with a degree in 
agricultural economics and is 
presently employed by The Gun 
Shop at South Plains Mall. 

In lieu of the traditional 
rehearsal dinner, George and 
Roy Reed hosted the bride and 
her family at the Fifty Yard Line 
in Lubbock following the bride's 
December 17 graduation. 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Green and 
Kaylene were accompanied by 
Bettie's mother, Mrs. Robert 

RAIN, SNOW INCREASE 

MONTH'S MOISTURE 

The Quitaque vicinity received 
.30 of an inch of moisture in rain 
and snow that fell Sunday and 
Monday. This brought the Febru-
ary total to nine inches of snow 
and 1.40 inches of moisture, 
according to the official records 
of City Secretary James Brun-
son. 

Portions of the Atlantic sea- 
board are sinking at a rate 

of about a foot per century. 

GET THIS FREE 
INSURANCE BOOKLET. 
BEFORE YOU NEED IT. 

Now there ore 2 reasons to visit an 

Independent Insurance Agent like us. 

First, we represent several companies—

not lust one. So we con give you expert 

advice on how to select the best Insurance 

coverage at the best price. 

And second, right now were 

offering an informative free booklet 

that makes choosing the right insurance 

coverage easier. 

Pick up your free booklet today 

Before you need it 

Chambliss of Plains, for a visit 
over the weekend with their son 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Green, Justen and Jaymie, at 
Beaumont. They reported a very 
nice visit. 

THE MORE-THAN-ONE-COMPANY 
INSURANCE AGENT 

CONNER 

INSURANCE AGENCY 

Quitaque, Texas 

YOUR Independent 
Insuronte AGENT 



your support for allowing farm-
ers to treat PIK commodities as 
having been grown on their own 
farm for tax purposes and to 

recognize the income from those 
PIK commodities at the time of 

their sale or use, -  Bentsen said. 
Under current tax law farmers 

would be required to pay taxes 
on the estimated value of the 
commodities in the year they 
receive the commodities. 

Under the change advocated 
by Bentsen, farmers would pay 
taxes based on the actual sale 
price during the year in which 
the farmers sell the commodities. 

statement similar to the 
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MRS. RAQUEL CRAY 

DIES LN MEXICO 

Mrs. Raquel Chavira. 50. of 
Lakeview and formerly of Tur-
key, passed away on February 12 
while she and her husband were 
visiting her parents in Chihua 
hua, Mexico. She died of a heart 
attack. Funeral services were 
conducted in Mexico on Sunday. 
February 13. 

Survivors include her hus 
band, Samuel Chavira of Lake 
view; two sons, Jessie and 
Ramon of the home; five daugh 
ters. Mary Fierro of Turkey. 
Connie Jimenez. Juarez. Mexico. 
Esperanza and Isabel, El Paso. 
and Esther Vinson. Plainview. 
Also her parents and three 
sisters from Chihuahua. Mexico. 

Mr. and Mrs. Randy Clay of 
Cross S Ranch, Post, Texas. 
spent the weekend in Quitaque 
visiting. They spent Saturday 
night with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Odis Reagan, and Sunday 
with Randy's grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Kimbell. Bruce 
Setliff of Turkey and Karen 
Wellman visited in the afternoon 
in the Kimbell home. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. B. Finney 
were in Plainview Friday for Mr. 
Finney to get a checkup with his 
doctor. Mrs. Finney reports he 
got a good report. They took 
their granddaughter out to lunch 
and stopped by to visit with their 
grandson for a few minutes 
before returning home. 

Mrs. Gerry Hilbers and son. 
Brent. of Idalou visited her 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Horace 
McDonald in Quitaque Saturday. 

BENTSEN SEEKS 

REASSURANCE FOR 

FARMERS, PUBLIC 

SUPPORT FOR TAX CHANGE 

Senator Lloyd Bentsen called 
on the President and on Chair-
men of Congressional tax writing 
committees Wednesday to re 
assure farmers that participation 
in the Payment-in-Kind program 
won't cost them a tax penalty. 

Bentsen asked the officials to 
publicly support a change in the 
Internal Revenue Code—retro 
active to January 1. 1983—that 
would for tax purposes treat 
commodities farmers receive un 
der Payment-in-Kind as though 
they were grown by the farmers 

-The U.S. Department of 
Agriculture is proposing to im 
plement a farm program known 
as Payment-in Kind IPIKI under 
which farmers would take crop 
land out of production in return 
for surplus commodities which 
are now in storage. -  Bentsen said 
in identical letters to President 
Reagan. Chairman Dan Rosten 
kowslu of the House Ways and 
Means Committee and Chairman 
Robert Dole of the Senate 
Finance Committee. 
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tax legislation before that date. I 
request that you publicly empress 

THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 1983 
one I am seeking was issued in 
1981 to assure investors that 
depreciation changes would be 
part of a pending tax bill and that 
these changes would be retroac-
tive." Bentsen said. 
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THACKER JEWELRY 
200 Broadway 

Roaring Springs, Texas 79256 

OUR SEMI-ANNUAL SALE STARTS 
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 24TH AT 10:00 A.M. 
THROUGH SATURDAY, MARCH 12TH. 

EVERYTHING IN THE STORE 50", TO 75", 
O 
kattottotto

FFRETAIL.
iatmoow:twarattutiramilEtvattoottottrtaiattortatto- 

SELECTED 
slrttXtttt4tnttttli:lttlttrtOr,t-tslttttt4tt

SPECIALS
,tltttt4MigtVtttetttttttttVttMOVtl; ttlttrtt  

RETAIL SALE PRICE 
ct. Diamond Studs $580.00 $199.00 

. cl. Diamond Drop $300.00 $99.00 

20 Diamond .25 ct. Heart Pendant $640.00 $215.00 

5 Diamond .43 ct. Rope Bracelet $1,940.00 $650.00 

7 Diamond .30 ct. Wedding Set $900.00 $299.00 

15 Diamond .44 ct. Dinner Ring $1,080.00 $360.00 

29 Diamond 2.20 ct. Dinner Ring $6,200.00 $2,070.00 

7 inch Boston Link Bracelet $36.00 $11.95 

16 inch Boston Link Necklace $89.00 $27.95 

11E-41400000011000/4 1100004  . tit - 1411-041$4 Ott _4040 
WE HAVE JUST FINISHED SHOWING OUR NEW LINE 
OF JEWELRY FOR 1983 AT THE JEWELRY SHOW IN 
DALLAS. IT, ALONG wr - 1-A OUR REGULAR LINE, 
WILL BE ON DISPLAY. 

COME SEE US IN THE HEART OF THE BUSINESS 
DISTRICT OF ROARING SPRINGS. 

PHONE TOLL FREE: IN TEXAS 800/692-4249 
OUT OF STATE 800/858-4191 

FORMER QUITAQUE 

RESIDENT BURIED 

AT SUNRAY TUESDAY 

C. E. Bedwell, 78. died at his 
home in Sunray Friday evening, 
February 19. 1983. 

He was born in Center Point, 
Arkansas. September 27, 1904. 
He moved with his family to 
Gasoline in 1920. and began 
employment at the First Nation-
al Bank in Quitaque August 1, 
1928 as bookkeeper and janitor 
after graduating from Tyler 
Commercial College on June 6, 
1928. He served on the board of 
directors at the First National 
Bank in Quitaque and still held 
this position at his death. 

He advanced to cashier and 
loan officer at the First National 
Bank in Quitaque. 

In May. 1951, Mr. Bedwell 
moved to Sunray and on July 1. 
1951, he opened the Sunray State 
Bank. He was president and 
chairman of the board. On March  

11, 1978, he was one of eleven 
area bankers who were honored 
for 50 years of service in 
banking. 

He was a member of the 
Floydada Masonic Lodge. and 
was a deacon in the First Baptist 
Church in Quitaque. He was also 
a deacon in the Sunray Baptist 
Church, of which he was a 
member at the time of his death. 
He was a charter member of the 
Floydada Lions Club, and was 
also past president of the Sunray 
Lions Club. 

Services were held Tuesday. 
February 22, 1983, at Sunray 
Baptist Church. with the Rev. M. 
G. Upton of Orangevale, Califor-
nia, the Rev. W. C. Carpenter of 
Lewiston, Idaho, and the Rev. 
Kim Norwood of Lubbock, offi-
ciating. Burial was in the Lane 
Memorial Cemetery by Morrison 
Funeral Directors. 

Survivors include his wife, 
Gladys; two sons, John Lewis 
Bedwell of Norman, Oklahoma 

MRS. BUSTER DUNHAM 

BURIED AT QUITAQUE 

Mrs. Ruth B. Dunham, 62, of 
Amarillo died Wednesday of last 
week. 

Services were held at 10 a.m. 
Saturday at Schooler-Gordon 
Colonial Chapel with the Rev. 
James Albritton, pastor of Jour-
ney Street Baptist Church in 
Amarillo. officiating. Graveside 
rites were held at 2:00 p.m. in 
Resthaven Cemetery at Quita-
que. 

She married V. L. (Buster) 
Dunham in 1938 at Santa Rosa, 
New Mexico. 

and Carroll Wayne Bedwell of 
Sunray; two brothers, Joe N. 
Bedwell of Quitaque and L. J. 
Bedwell, jr. of Mineral Wells, and 
four grandchildren. 

The family requests that me-
morials be made to Boys Ranch. 
Faith City Mission or the Sunray 
Baptist Church Library Fund. 

She moved to Amarillo in 1976 
from Olton. 

Survivors include her hus-
band; four sons, Darrell Dunham 
of Canyon. Bob Dunham of 
Houma, Louisiana. Mickey Dun-
ham of Monahans and Billy 
Dunham of Amarillo; a sister. 
Mrs. Mamie Wood of South 
Plains, and ten grandchildren. 

Buster Dunham is a former 
resident of the Quitaque area. 

MRS. BUCK HALE DIES 

THURSDAY IN AMARILLO 

Mrs. Buck (Mary Ora) Hale. 
74, died Thursday in Amarillo. 
She was a sister-in-law of Mrs. 
Walter Geissler. 

Funeral services were held at 
10 a.m. Saturday in W. W. Rix 
Funeral Chapel with the Rev. 
Steve Adcock, minister of First 
United Methodist Church in 
Hartley, and Gene Brock of 
Hereford, officiating. Graveside 
services were held at 3:30 p.m. in 

Dreamland Cemetery at Turkey. 
Mrs. Hale was born at Camp-

bell and moved to Hereford in 
1953 from Turkey. She moved to 
Hartley in February 1982 after 
the death of her husband to 
whom she was married on 
October 30, 1925 at Longview. 
She was a seamstress and a 
homemaker. She was a member 
of Hartley United Methodist 
Church. 

Survivors include two sons. 
Terry Hale of Amarillo and Joe 
Mack Hale of Hartley; a sister, 
Mrs. Cecil Hancock of Borger, 
and five grandchildren. 

SERVICES HELD FOR 

WILLIAM MONTGOMERY, 76 

Funeral services for William 
(Bill) Montgomery, 76, of Turkey 
were conducted at the Turkey 
Church of Christ on February 22, 
1983, at 2:00 p.m. with Elgin 
Conner. Church of Christ minis-
ter from Quitaque, and the Rev. 
Melvin Clinton, pastor of the 
First Baptist Church in Turkey, 
officiating. Burial followed in 
Dreamland Cemetery, under the 
direction of Seigler Funeral 
Home. 

Mr. Montgomery was born in 
Rotan, Texas on December 1, 
1906. He was a son of the late 
John and Argie Montgomery and 
came to the Turkey area with 
them in 1911. He was engaged in 
farming until just a few years 
ago when ill health forced him to 
retire. He was a member of the 
Turkey Church of Christ. 

Survivors are four brothers, 
Winburn Montgomery of Othello, 
Washington, Frank Montgomery 
of Matador, Leslie Montgomery 
of Odessa and Arch Montgomery 
of Turkey. 

Active pallbearers were Dar-
rell Cruse of Flomot, Buster 
Hanna, Hubert Price, Rickey 
Fuston, E. D. Richmond and Tom 
Eudy, all of Turkey. 

Honorary pallbearers were J. 
R. Adamson, jr.. John Lane, Jack 
Lacy, Otho Stubbs, T. W. Bell 
and Lynn Davis, all of Turkey. 

BROTHER OF MRS. TAYLOR 

BURIED AT CHANNING 

Funeral services for William 
Floyd Roberts, 75, a resident of 
Channing for over 30 years were 
conducted February 5, 1983, at 
the Channing Church of Christ 
with Dale Pearson of Amarillo 
officiating. 

Mr. Roberts was born near 
Guymon, Oklahoma. He came to 
Texas with his parents in 1909 
and grew up on a farm six miles 
west of Old Mobeetie. 

He married Irene Hale in 1931. 
and later moved to Channing 
where he was employed by 
Western Sand and Gravel Corn-
pany until poor health interven-
ed. At the time of his retirement, 
he was Justice of the Peace in 
Hartley County. 

He was a member of the 
Church of Christ. 

Survivors are his wife, Irene, 
of the home; a son. Gayland, of 
Hobbs, New Mexico; a daughter, 
Mrs. Nelda Mayes of League 
City; a sister, Mrs. Edna Taylor 
of Quitaque, and five grandchild-
ren. 

Interment was in the Channing 
Cemetery by Morrison Funeral 
Directors of Dumas. 

Mrs. April Thompson returned 
home Monday after being in 
Lockney General Hospital more 
than two weeks. It is reported 
she is improving well. 

THURSDAY, FERRI:AM 24. 1983 
	

THE VALLEY TRIBUNE 
	

PAGE FIVE 



P.M.F, SIX 

Mental Health Code Revision Introduced 

Senator Ray Farabee 1D-Wich-
ita Falls) introduced legislation a 
few days ago revising the Texas 
Mental Health Code. calling on 
the state legislature to modern-
ize the code to keep up with the 
medical advances of the past 25 
years. 

"When the original code pas-
sed in 1957, it was a model act for 
the other 49 states. However, 
two decades of medical progress, 
the development of new treat-
ment systems and recent legal 
challenges have made these 
revisions a necessity for the 
protection of both the public and 
the mentally ill," Farabee stated. 

The Senator, noted for his long 
standing involvement in the 
mental health area, emphasized 

that many of the changes his 
legislation proposes focus on 
clearing up organizational and 
consistency probleins. The major 
substantive changes are listed 
below. 

'Changes in voluntary in-pa. 
tient services would allow par-
ents to admit children under age 
16, permit minors 16 or over to 
seek care by themselves, and let 
courts initiate involuntary com-
mitment if certain criteria are 
met. 

'Modifications in emergency 
procedures would allow a war. 
rentless apprehension by peace 
officers for 24-hour detention if 
an imminent risk of serious harm 
is perceived. Changes in the 
protective custody orders re- 

FARM SALE 
AUCTION - EQUIPMENT 

Saturday, March 5, 1983 

Sale Time - 10:30 a.m. 

James (Bud) Bailey and Others, Owners 

Located: From Ouitaque, Texas 

2 Mlles North On Highway 1065 

DULIN, REAGAN & EVANS — 

AUCTIONEERS 

VILVEVILIENEWEILEILIt. 

research and the right to partici-
pate in an individualized treat-
ment plan. 

"The changes we are looking at 
will balance two primary goals of 
the mental health system. We 
want to protect the public from 
persons with serious mental 
illness. We also want to safe-
guard the rights of mentally ill 
citizens by ensuring that no one 
is deprived of their liberty or 
overmedicated when it is not 
necessary," Farabee explained. 

The code revisions would 
include permanent changes pro- 

viding a constitutional procedure 
for protective custody orders, 
parts of which were ruled 
unconstitutional earlier this 
year. A similar temporary mea-
sure has passed the legislature 
and is awaiting the Governor's 
signature, but it expires August 
31,1983. 

'We are always getting ready 
to live but never living." 

Ralph Waldo Emerson 

JUDY'S STITCH SHOP 
310 Jones Street, Quitaque, Texas 

Embroidery Classes Begin in January. 
Interested, Call 455-1319 Before January 8 

Do Embroidery & Monogramming for the Public 
Sell Handcrafted Items on Consignment 
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-T TOMMY TURNER CATTLE 
995-2515 995-4006 Tulia, Texas 

CATTLE FOR 
P-I-K PROGRAM 
Will help you buy your cattle 

for PIK program, and can sell your cattle 
off grazed-out wheat and haygrazer. 

Can Process If Needed 

%% orship Services at 
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 

Quitaque, Texas 

I lit ii\I11111 UNI 	\I Its' HI PH11t 111111 

quire a "probable cause" hearing 
within 72 hours of detention 
before that detention can contin-
ue its full 14 days. 

'Alterations in court-ordered 
mental health services would 
require evidence of mental ill-
ness and specific evidence of 
present danger to self or others 
or severe deterioration and dis-
tress before care can be ordered. 
Other changes include using the 
least restrictive appropriate 
treatment setting available and 
uniform procedures for both 
short and long-term duration 
orders. 

'Proposed additional patients' 
rights include presumption of 
legal competency, freedom from 
unnecessary or excessive medi-
cation, a humane and safe 
treatment environment, the 
right to refuse to participate in 

Roddy Klinnert 
806-8742642 .20 Years in the Business• 

Plumbing, Electrical, Heating & Air Conditioning 

Office Phone 806-874-3293 

TRI-STATE MECHANICAL INC. 

Larry Helms 
806-858-4401 

P. O. Box 966, Highway 287 East 
	

Clarendon, Texas 79226 

Mechanical Contractors Serving the Tri-State Area 
Industrial, Commercial & Residential Installations 

GINS, MILLS & ELEVATORS ELECTRIC MOTOR CONTROL WORK! 
24-hour Emergency Service — 2-way Radio Equipped Service Trucks 

Wood-burning EARTH STOVES & Accessories Dealer 

FOR FEB. 25 & 26 

Boneless WRIGHT DRY CURED HAMS 
CHUCK While Supply Lasts 
ROAST 	 LB. 	$1.79 Whole 	$1.69 LB. Sliced 	$1.79 

Whole T-Bone 
FRYERS 	 LB. 	59c STEAK 	 LB. $2.85 

Fresh Ground Extra Lean 
HAMBURGER 	LB. 	$1.19 STEW MEAT 	LB. $1.79 

Ranch Style 300 can Shurfine Chunk Oil Pack 6 1/4 oz. 
BEANS 	 2 for 79c LITE TUNA 	EA. 69c 

Shurfine Fresh Shelled 300 can Reg. or Smoked 12 oz. can 
BLACKEYED PEAS 3 for $1.00 SPAM $1.49 

Open Pit or Cattleman's 18 oz. MARYLAND CLUB COFFEE 
While Supply Lasts Regular, Drip, Electric Perk 
BARBECUE SAUCE EA. 59c 1 lb. can 	 $2.29 

Cheer 49 oz. box 25c off label Shurfine 48 ct. 
LAUNDRY DETERGENT $1.79 TEA BAGS 	Box 79c 

Sunshine Crispy 16 oz. box Dawn Giant Size 22 oz. btl. 
CRACKERS 	 79c DISH DETERGENT $1.39 

Texas Ruby Red 5# bag Large Cello Pkg. 
GRAPEFRUIT 	 99c CELERY HEARTS 69c 

Central America Golden Large Head California 
BANANAS 	LB. 	33c LETTUCE 59c 

C & L FOOD 
MEMBER STORE dIrFMTNES 
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e Give Green Stamp. 
Double Stamp. on Wedneeday• 



Our Flowers Say It Best 

Shop At 

FARLEY'S FLOWERS 
& VARIETY 
Qt ITAQt E, TEXAS 

455-1410 

For All Your Flower & Variety Needs 

Wendell. Roberta, Johnnie, Debbie ,  

A & B CONSTRUCTION 

ROOFING — REMODELING — REPAIRS 

Electrical Contracting. Free Estimates 
('all Collect: 4211184 Mike Berry  or 

259-2995 Kirk Anderson 

eOpleS 
jute 

/Bank of Turkey, U.S.A. 
:x 152 • l't:ze (8061923 1321 • Tarim Texas 79261 
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Rev. W. L. Armstrong showed 
slides of the Holy Land and 
Greece to an appreciative ■ ud• 
fence Thursday night, February 
17, when the Hall County Retired 
Teachers Organization met in the 
Silver Room of the First National 
Bank in Memphis. While showing 
the slides he shared with the 
members some of his experiences 
while he was in these countries. 

He was introduced by program 
chairman J. R. Adamson. jr. 

Following the business meet-
ing, conducted by Lorean Hart. 
president. Marjorie Bain gave a 
report on the 68th Legislative 
committees and the measures of 
interest to retired teachers that 
will be considered in this session  

of the Legislature. 
Refreshments were served to 

the following members and 
guests: Ethel Hillhouse. Clara 
Pyeatt, Dorothy Gurley, Valmon 
Payne. Mary Beth Adamson, J. 
R. Adamson. jr.. Pansy Srygley. 
Beth Lemons, Carrie Belle King, 
Lorean Hart, Tops Gilreath, 
Marjorie Bain. Gordon Bain, 
Ernest Lee and W. L. Arm 
strong. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bailey of 
Lubbock spent the day with his 
brother and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bud Bailey, in Quitaque. They 
attended services at the First 
Baptist Church and renewed 
acquaintenances. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Whitting-
ton drove to Lubbock Saturday 
to meet his daughter and grand-
daughter, Mrs. Jennifer Lord 
and Samantha. of Pinetop. Ari-
zona. They are spending the 
week here. 

Other guests in the Whitting-
ton home Sunday were Mr. and 
Mrs. Willie Gragson of Welling-
ton, Mr. and Mrs. Scott Raines 
and Sasha of Leto's, Mr. and 
Mrs. Darrell Igusmann and Jef-
frey of Hedley, Mr. and Mrs. Ron 
Morris and Kimber of Plainview, 
Mr. and Mrs. Kuen Faulkner of 
Plainview, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Farley of Turkey, and local folk. 
Dee Whittington, Shon Phelps 
and Cora Gragson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Carter 
drove to Canyon and spent 
Friday night and Saturday visit-
ing their daughter and family. 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Hedrick and 
boys. They returned home Satur-
day evening and their son and 
family. Mr. and Mrs. Mel Carter 
and Melanie came and spent the 
night. Mel spoke at the Rock 
Creek Church of Christ Sunday 
and the Ralph Carters drove up 
with him and his family and 
attended church services. They 
returned to their respective 
homes from there. 

Walt Rice, Colvin and Criss 
Morrison drove to Red River. 
New Mexico over the Student's 
Holiday and enjoyed skiing to the 
fullest, they report. They drove 
up Friday and returned Sunday. 

Mrs. Ruel Skinner was taken 
to Silverton to the doctor by 
Quitaque Ambulance Monday 
afternoon. She returned home 
and her daughter reports  as we 
go to press that  she  is improving. 

HIGHTOWER TO MAKE 

DEFENSE TRIP TO 

MIDDLE EAST 

Congressman Jack Hightower 
announced last week that he will 
be making a short 13-day defense 
inspection trip to five key Middle 
East countries in connection with 
his responsibilities on the House 
Appropriations Committee and 
particularly as a result of his new 
Defense Subcommittee assign-
ment. The trip will start the 
third week in February when no 
legislative business is scheduled 
in the House of Representatives. 

"My committee assignments 
involve various kinds of appro-
priations and one of the reasons 
for the trip is to see first-hand 
how some of our money is being 
spent and whether we need to 
make some serious adjust-
ments," Hightower said. "We 
have U. S. troops now in the 
Middle East, in Beirut where 
we're going, and I want to talk 
with some of them to get their 
own assessment of whether they 
should be over there and how 
long they should stay." The 
defense trip will include stops at 
U. S. military and diplomatic 
posts not only in Beirut, Leban-
on, but also Egypt. Israel, Saudi 
Arabia, Tunisia and Italy. 

"We have the AWACs planes 
in Saudi Arabia, foreign assis-
tance going to Egypt and Israel, 
critical Middle Eastern oil fields 
important to the Western demo-
cracies, and  a  number of hungry 
countries that  I  would like to  see 
purchase more of the 13th 
District's farm commodities," 
Hightower said. "I think I'm 
going to get better answers to 
questions my constituents  are 
asking  if  I talk face-to-face with 
some of our people over there  as 

wel as our allies and adversar-
ies,' Hightower said. 

While on the Appropriations 
Committee, Hightower has been 
directly involved in subcommit-
tee work effecting U. S. trade. 
promotion of U. S. exports, drug 
enforcement programs. and espe-
cially the effort to improve 
security for American personnel 
and communications at U. S. 
missions and embassies over-
seas. Hightower will be accom-
panied by other members of the 
Committee and by Undersecre-
tary of State Jerome Van Cork 
om and Sheldon Krys, Executive 
Director of Near Eastern and 
South Asian Affairs. 

"As most people know, last 
year I voted against the Reagan 
Administration's foreign aid bill, 
the largest ever. and I think we 
need to take a very hard look this 
year at foreign aid in general 
because of our own domestic 
economic situation," Hightower 
said. "I think a trip of this sort 
can help us focus on where 
American military aid should be 
provided, and where we should 
restrict or end it." 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Smith 
accompanied their daughter. 
Mrs. Willie Bradshaw and daugh-
ter, Anna Leta, of Floydada to 
Waxahachie over the weekend to 
visit Mrs. Smith's brother and 
wife, Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Montgomery. Mrs. Tommy Beck 
of Flomot accompanied them 
also. They were met there by 
their son, Dwayne Smith, and his 
wife from Dallas  on  Friday night. 
Dwayne went back again Satur-
day to visit. Mrs. Smith's sister, 
Emma Price of Durant, Oklaho. 
ma, was there visiting. Mrs. 
Smith says they really had  a 
good time. 

Mr. Montgomery has been 
quite ill and recently received  a 

pacemaker. He is reported to be 
feeling better. 
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Rev. Armstrong Gives Program 

For Hall Co. Retired Teachers 
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Let Your 

MONEY WORK 

FOR YOU 

Open a 
\N1 SAVINGS ACCOUNT 

With Us  

PRECISION MACHINE SHOP WORK 

SHAFTS MADE. KEYWAYS CUT, 
FLYWHEELS TURNED. Single Tool Threading. 

Our Lathe Capacity Goes Up to 31”e10 ft. Centers 

CALL 1-347-2257, MATADOR 

ELAINE'S BEAUTY SHOPPE 

Phone 455-1305 

ELAINE, KATHY 
WEDNESDAY Tll1011 	FRIDAY 

Courteous Service 

OZEAN'S SERVICE 

000000000000000 000000 00  0000  0 	 000 

AMWAY DISTRIBUTOR 
Call (806)423-1378 

KAY EUDY 
Turkey. Texas 79261 

000000000 000 000000000.0 

H & R BLOCK 
H & R BLOCK OFFICE IS LOCATED AT 

106 WEST MISSOURI STREET 

Floydada, Texas Phone 983-5233 

00000000 



ALL RISK FEDERAL CROP INSURANCE 

Lee's Insurance 
ORVILLE and RUTH LEE 

Flomot, Texas 
806-469-5370 

PROCTOR ELECTRONICS 
T.V. - Radio Repair 

Quitaque, Texas 	455-1445 

DR. 0. R. McINTOSH 
Optometrist 

South Main Street 	 Phone 983-3460 
FLOYDADA. TEXAS 

PAGE EIGHT THE VALLEY TRIBUNE THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 1983 

BUY, SELL, TRADE OR RENT THROUGH THE 

CLASSIFIED ADS 
FOR SALE 

SCHOOL BUS FOR SALE 

The Turkey-Quitaque 1SD is 
accepting bids on a 1971 Ford 
Van 12-passenger school bus. 
Bidding will be by sealed bids 
and will be opened March 14 at 
the regular school board meet-
ing. Bids should be submitted at 
the school administration office. 

ONE WEEK SALE AT CAP-
ROCK HOME CENTER: Febru-
ary 25 - March 5. Many good 
bargains, including ALL 
PAINTS. 	 36-1te 
MAYTAG SERVICE & SALES: 
Factory Trained. Also other 
name brand appliances. Call 
455-1193. Caprock Home Center, 
Quitaque, Texas 79255. 30-tic 

FOR SALE: ZENITH STEREO, 
AM-FM, 8 track/recorder turn-
table and two large speakers. 
Good price. Call 423-1355. 31-tic 

GOOD USED CAR: 1977 Pontiac 
Grand Prix, silver-gray with red 
interior in good condition, power 
seats, windows and locks. Call 
423-1355. 31-tic 

ONE OWNER 1979 CHEVRO-
let Chevette, two door, four 
speed, air cond. Phone 806-455-
1264 after 6:00 p.m. 37-4tc 

GERMANIA FARM MUTUAL 
Aid Association: Reasonable, 
sound property insurance. 11 you 
want to save, contact Mrs. 
Orville Lee, Flomot. Call 806-469-
5370. 23-tic 

DO PLUMBING: All types. 
Jimmy Vivens, Turkey, Texas. 
Phone 423-1496. 	33-4te 

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE 
COMPANY: For insurance of all 
lines, call Tommy Edwards, [806) 
455-1129 or 823-2189. 33tfc 

THELMA LOVING'S five-room 
house with extra large living 
room. Has central cooling and 
heating, carport, double garage 
with three-room apartment and 
storage room. On corner lot 
south of Baptist Church. Call 
Jimmy Davidson in Quitaque or 
Vivian Tiffin in Silverton. 41-tic 

months preceding his death. May 
God bless you. 

Edna Taylor 

Mrs. Mark Butler, Amy and 
Jeff and Margie Goyne of Amaril-
lo visited Mr. and Mrs. Rufus 
Butler last Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hinkson of 
Lazbuddie spent Saturday night 
and Sunday with their son and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Hinkson and Landon, as they 
were enroute home from Temple. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Proctor 
and Mr. and Mrs. Oval Cogdill 
visited in Muleshoe during the 
weekend with a brother of the 
two ladies, Lester Baker, and an 
uncle, Floyd Baker of Wetumka, 
Oklahoma. On Saturday Mr. and 
Mrs. Delton Smith and son of 
Conway, a cousin of Robert 
Proctor, visited in the Proctor 
home. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Hill of 
Turkey and the Jerry Weather-
lys of Memphis visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Rod Hill and son in Amarillo 
Saturday. 

Mrs. Jessie Coker returned to 
her home last week after making 
an extended visit with her 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Crumley, in Amarillo. 
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Efficiency 

'Fully 

Adjustable 

Shelves 

'Vegetable 

Hydrator 

Drawers 

CHOOSE 
A 

and 
... 
ahead. 

fifteen 

FRIGIDAIRE. 

AM1111A 

Engineered to Meet the Energy 
needs of Today and Tomorrow. 

Quitaque, 

Typewriters, 

Quitaque, 

Memphis. 

Thursday 

UNDERGROUND 

Installed. 

Fogerson 
Silverton, 

LOCKNEY 
Inspected. 
through 

Wrapped, 
Guaranteed. 
tenberry, 

LOCKSMITH. 

Duplicate 
installed. 
throughout 
Pro-Lock 

R BLOCK INCOME TAX 
Call Kay Calvert, 

or Jana Payne, 455-1297, 

	

Texas. 	33-tic 

SEWING MACHINES, 
Cleaners, Smith Corona 

Adding Machines, 
Sales and Service. Buy 
service 	here. 	Call 

455-1101, or call 423-
in Turkey. Call 259-2716 

Office located at 
in Memphis. Here every 

weeks on Thursdays. 28-tic 

& HEELS: Pickup 
for laundry and dry cleaning. 

pickup and delivery 
Steam Laundry. Call 

for information. 28-tic 

PLASTIC 
Water and Gas 

EtatIchoe Service, 
Leaks and Repairs. 
Silverton Metal Works. 

ARE A DEALER FOR 
Wallpaper. Prompt 

Sample books available. 

	

Lumber 	& 	Supply, 
Phone 823-2021. 29-tic 

MEAT CO. USDA 
Kill days Monday 

Friday. Custom proces-
Wholesale and Retail 
Halves and Quarters 

	

Frozen 	and 	Fully 
Sam & Kelly 

owners and managers. 
652-3305, corner of U. 

and Farm Road 378 South. 

LOCKS OPEN-
Locks repaired. Keys made 
locks that have no keys. 

keys made. Deadbolts 
24-hour mobile service 

area. Don Probasco. 
Shop, 983-3834. 

south of Silverton, High-
207. 36-1tc 

ADVERTISEMENT 

Insurance 

The 

The 

TURKEY 

Monday, 

FOR BIDS 

City of Turkey will accept 
bids on City Automobile 

until March 11, 1983 
p.m. 

bids will be opened at 
on March 11, 1983. 

City Council reserves 
to reject any or all bids. 

City of Turkey 
Ruth Fuston, City Secretary 

CITY ELECTION 

BE HELD APRIL 2 

City Election for Turkey 
be held on April 2, 1983. 

are three places on 
Place 2, Place 3 and Place 

January 31, 1983 
first day anyone was eligible 

an application to have 
placed 	on 	the 	ballot. 

March 2, 1983, is 
day for filing for a place 

ballot. 
Ruth Fuston 
City Secretary 

Frigidaire 

refrigerators 

but 

WITH 

FEET... 

styling 
of service 

the years 

the past 

SIZE 

quality 

FROM 14 TO 21 CUBIC 
TO FIT EVERY FAMILY 

gffers you the convenience. rich 
craftsmanship that mean years 

you'll also save on energy costs in 
Overall energy efficiency in Frigidaire 

has been improved by 50% in 
years! 

CARDS OF 
THANKS 

especially, 

Roberts. 
Thank 

especially, 

want to thank all my friends 
remembered me with cards, 

telephone calls, gifts and, 
prayers while I was in 

hospital and since I have 
home. May God bless each 

April Thompson 

wish to express deep grati-
and appreciation to every-

for kind acts of concern and 
shown me at the passing 

my 	dear 	brother, 	Floyd 

you 	for 	the 	cards. 
calls, memorials, and 
for the prayers offer-

in 	his 	behalf 	during 	the 

WEST TEXAS UTRITIES COMPANY 

HERE TODAY, HERE TOMORROW 

QUALITY DEPENDABIUTY AND THE BEST IN FACTORY 

TRAINED APPLIANCE SERVICE. 
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